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K m e n
By

Kitty Montgomeiy

It is always surprising to me when 
an elected official takes the stance that 
public business is no business of the 
public. When a person is elected to a 
position, he or she is accountable to 
the public who elected him or her. 
There is no assurance, whatever, that 
the position is a permanent one. It 
depends on pleasing the public and 
the public looks to the local newspaper 
for that official’s record and response 
to the constituents.

Indeed, it is the newspaper’s obliga­
tion to tell the people what is going on 
in their local government. We try to 
give a concise report on the commis­
sioners court, because they run every­
thing in the county. Through our 
observation of the court’s operation 
lately we have concluded that most 
decisions are made either in executive 
session or discussed out of court and 
everything is cut and dried when the 
vote comes up in open court. We 
seriously doubt the public is getting a 
true and accurate account of county 
business, through the newspaper or 
anywhere else for that matter.

We are not “ out to get’’ anyone and 
we are sorry some of our officials feel 
that we are. If we had been out to do a 
hatchet job, we would have told the 
public some months ago about an 
improper $17,000 expenditure made 
by a member of the court. It was a 
technical mistake and it would have 
served no good purpose to expose this 
fact.

We also think each commissioner 
should take care of the business in his 
precinct, at the same time looking at 
the overall good of the county and all 
the citizens therein. That’s the job 
they have been elected to do by the 
voters in their precinct. The county 
judge is technically the head of the 
court and all matters concerning the 
entire county should be discussed in 
open court.

Of course, this is the opinion of this 
column writer, and, we believe the 
public in general.

It seems to us there was no reason 
to place the cemetery in the parks 
department and completely ignore the 
cemetery association which has been 
responsible for years.

We noticed they did not see clear to 
take over the hospital and ignore the 
board, nor place the civic center under 
the parks department. The cemetery 
association has been running the 
cemetery for longer than these two 
entities all together. They say the 
cemetery employees are county em­
ployees and the county must hire a 
supervisor to supervise the foremen 
there. Are not hospital employees also 
county employees as well as civic 
center employees? I fail to see the 
justice here.

Two cemetery employees were fired 
and given no notice nor reason a 
couple of weeks ago. We know they 
were doing their jobs. The two women 
were replaced by men. I also fail to see 
the justice here.

I have personal knowledge that 
women can do the job as well as men. 
For the past several months a former 
female cemetery employee has been 
doing my yard. She is better than any 
yard man I have ever had. She does 
the work in half the time and is 
thorough and efficient. She has sever­
al yards under contract, some of which 
belong to men, and I have yet to hear 
any complaint.

kk
Before closing. I’d like to make one 

comment about the presidential elec­
tion. If over 90 percent of the work 
force is employed and less than 10% 
unemployed, how on earth does 
Walter Mondale plan to win an 
election on a platform that promises to 
raise taxes? Did you ever know an 
employed person who was willing to 
vote for someone who promises to 
raise his taxes? I think not.
Football contest 
winner announced

Winner of the weekly football 
contest for the first week was Ruben 
Mendez. Mendez was tied with two 
others, Johnny Tambunga and Merce­
des Martinez, until the tie-breaker. 
All three picked Houston to win, 
although they lost, Mendez had 
nearest to the true score.

The weekly contest is on the sports 
page, sponsored by local merchants. 
Anyone is eligible to win. Entry 
blanks must be in by 5 p.m. Friday or 
in the mail before then, or may be 
dropped by the Stockman office.

Sludeni Council
The council, informally gathered on 
the steps of the school will have much 
input in Ozona High School affairs this 
season. Officers are David Delgado,

president; Raul Delgado, vice-presi­
dent; Steve Sanchez, secretary and 
Haley Anderson, treasurer.

Court refuses to allow
cemetery [uri ion

The Crockett County Cemetery As­
sociation was effectively all b it killed 
off at a meeting of the Crockett 
County Commissioners Court Mon­
day. Mrs. Jack Baggett, president of 
the association, met with the court to 
ask that the cemetery b i taken from 
the supervision of the parks depart­
ment and reinstated under the juris­
diction of the associat’on, where it has 
been since its inception in 1919.

Several members of the associa­
tion were on hand ^or the meeting and 
to support Mrs. Baggett, including 
some of the workers who had been 
fifed recently and one who was on 
vacation.

A bad situ? tion developed last year 
when without the knowledge of the 
cemetery association, the cemetery 
was placea under the supervision of 
the parks department. This resulted in 
the parts supervisor, Onesimo Ortiz, 
the association president, Mrs. Bag­
gett, and the cemetery foreman, 
Chona Vela, giving instructions.

A’l Mrs. Baggett requested was that 
the cemetery be taken out of the parks 
department and returned to the asso­
ciation and tbit the foreman, Mrs.

Vela, be given a county pickup to use 
for picking up cemetery employees 
and hauling trash rather than using 
her own vehicle as she has been doing 
in the past

Although Mrs. Baggett made a very 
clear presentation, members of the 
court apparently misunderstood, and 
one commissioner asked why she 
wanted Ortiz fired. This was not even 
mentioned although the concensus 
was Ortiz had all he could do to take 
care of the ball parks, parks, city 
streets and dumpground.

Not one member of the court spoke 
up on behalf of Mrs. Baggett and the 
cemetery association although for 65 
years it has been well-operated by the 
association with the county furnishing 
the employees. Mrs. Baggett has been 
president of the association for the 
past 24 years.

Bonnie Warth and Sammy Pierce 
spoke for the cemetery employees who 
have been taking care of the cemetery 
during the past year. One of the 
women, v ho had been terminated 
without n jtice by Ortiz, and replaced 
by a mile employee, asked to be 
heard, but County Attorney Tom

Benefit for elderly 
smashing success

The barbecue dinner held Friday 
evening at the Civic Center to benefit 
the Helping Hands for the Elderly was 
successful beyond the wildest dreams 
of the planners. Proceeds of over 
$2,000 were collected for the future 
home of a Senior Citizens Center.

The group which has been in 
operation for about a year with 
volunteers taking meals to the elderly 
each day has come quite a distance 
from its early beginnings.

The Parish Hall of the Catholic 
Church has been used to prepare 
meals. Each day volunteers gather 
and deliver food to various of the 
elderly. Those who are able pay a 
nominal fee for the meals and those 
who are unable to pay are not charged. 
The food comes from a Junction-based 
organization. The county gives $200 a 
month in assistance.

Recently an outreach worker was 
hired to see to the needs of the elderly. 
The county pledged $600 a month 
toward this salary until a grant could 
be received from the state. It was later 
discovered the county must apply for 
the grant and that is being done, 
according to County Judge A. O. 
Fields. However, the $600 has been 
allocated just until January 1, 1985.

The group with plans to build a 
senior citizens center or purchase a 
building with that in mind, asked that

the $600 from the county be contin­
ued. However, the letter was received 
by the court and the budget for 1985 
had already been set up. The court did 
assure the organization if they got in 
desparate need, the county would help 
out with finances, on a one-time 
basis.

Although memorials have been set 
up and the people of the county quite 
generous, the group feels it necessary 
to have pledged help fi-om the county 
government. They were in the process 
of purchasing a building when they 
discovered they were not in the budget, 
for 1985 and the $600 would not 
continue along with the grant. It did 
not seem feasible for individuals to 
sign a note for the $20,000 purchase of 
the building and more for the renova­
tion.

They feel the need for a center, 
although the meals would continue to 
be delivered each day to those who 
could not come to the center and they 
are asking the community to come to 
their aid.

The donation of a home or building 
would be a tax break for the donor and 
a wonderful help to the organization, 
to say nothing of the good public 
relations which would result. They 
welcome the input of the community. 
Anyone with some ideas may get in 
touch with Kathy Reavis, who heads 
up the organization.

After loss to Greenwood- - -

Lions look for
irst win Friday

By Gary Davis
Defense was the name of the game 

Friday night as the Ozona Lions were 
only able to combine for 50 rushing 
yards and 9 passing yards in a 12-0 
loss to the Greenwood Rangers. The 
Lions will have a chance to avenge 
their loss this Friday against the Eden 
Bulldogs. The game scheduled for 
8:00 p.m. in Lions Stadium, will be the 
annual Homecoming football game. 
Eden, like Ozona, will be looking for 
their first win of the new season as 
they were defeated by Menard 33-37 
last week.

The Lions were plagued by injuries 
which resulted in their having to start 
players at new positions. This prooved 
to be hendering to the team’s perform­
ance.

Junior, Harvey Fierro, started at the 
quarterback, Steve Sanchez threw for 
9 yards to Sophomore, Butch Gonzales

on the only successful pass play of the 
evening. Senior, David Delgado, who 
started as a running back, led his team 
in rushing with 31 yards on 15 carries. 
Seniors Danny Moran and Matt Gu­
tierrez also contributed to the rushing 
total with 8 and 7 yards respectively.

Greenwood’s Roger Smith led all 
rushers with 118 yards on 18 carries, 
including a 39-yard scoring run late in 
the 4th period of play. His six points 
was added to a previous score made by 
Terry O’Steen in the 2nd quarter to 
make up the final total.

Greenwood had 11 first downs. The 
lions only managed 5. The Rangers 
punted 4 times and forced the Lions to 
punt 6 times throughout the contest. 
The referees had a busy night as they 
penalized Greenwood for 60 yards and 
Ozona for 53.

The Rangers’ record now stands at 
1-0 while the Lions are at 0-1.

Homecoming this 
week tor O.H.S.

Cameron said this subject was not on 
the agenda and was too far afield.

The concensus of the court was the 
county crew will continue to run the 
cemetery, due to its growth and the 
fact that the county budgets so much 
money to the operation of the facility. 
Ortiz was not available due to his 
present hospitalization. The court did 
agree to the use of a county pickup for 
Mrs. Vela. Commissioners B. W. 
Stuart and Jesus Castro were vocal 
about approval of the county taking 
over the cemetery and Ortiz being the 
boss, and other members of the court 
made no objections.

In other business, county reports 
were given by the various depart­
ment heads. Henry Elledge, giving 
the road department report, reported 
street sealing had been finished for 
the year, the crew is working at 
Crockett Heights and has finished 
shooting asphalt there. He also dis­
cussed some equipment repair, before 
being asked to report back to the court 
for an executive session concerning 
some of the directions on personnel 
coming out of the last executive 
session.

Don Hopkins, hospital administra­
tor, gave the hospital report. Occu­
pancy for the past month was 18%, 
which is up from previous months. He 
reported the laundry deficiency down 
for the month and the four hospital 
rooms for the transfer to the care 
center approved.

In giving the civic center and youth 
center report. Garland Young reported 
Mrs. Garland Davis had been ap­
proved to replace Don Abbott on the 
center board. New directors for the 
Teen Council are Matt Guiterrez, 
Peggy Knox, Sharon McCrohan, and 
Jim Ethridge. Holdover teen directors 
are Amy Jones, Jennifer Probst, Andy 
Dews and Susan Scott.

In other business, members of the 
fire department asked for replacement 
of a pump. They were told the budget 
for next year had already been set, but 
promised a new truck the year after if 
revenues permit.

A letter from Kathy Reavis asking 
for assistance in the Helping Hands 
for the Elderly program was passed 
around. Mrs. Reavis asked for a 
continuation of the $600 the county is 
now paying for an outreach worker in 
addition to the grant the county is in 
the process of receiving. Again, the 
budget would not allow it, but the 
court agreed to help out if the 
organization got in a bind.

J. W. Johnson of Sonora, who will 
take over as 112th District Attorney 
January 1, appeared to ask the county 
about allocation for his office for the 
year. Johnson hf.d asked for $20,000. 
The court allocated $6,000 along with 
equipment and space as provided for 
the office of the D.A.
[Continued on Pg. 11]

High School graduates are invited to 
attend. The prices are $2.00 stag and 
$3.00 per couple.

Homecoming festivities for Ozona 
High School will begin on Thursday 
night, September 13, at 7:00 P.M. 
with a snake dance. Those partici­
pating will gather at the Village I h / x ^ Q ' I ' o r C
parking lot between 6:30 and 7:00 “ I w l  ■ w l  w
p.m. and will then make their way to 
the Davidson Memorial Gymnasium.
The Homecoming Pep Rally will be 
held there following the Snake Dance.

The crowning of the Ozona High 
School Football Queen will be Friday 
night prior to the football game. The 
nominees for Homecoming Queen are 
Haley Anderson, daughter of Mr. And 
Mrs. Ralph Anderson, who will be 
escorted by A1 Ramirez: Christy 
Parks, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Parks, who will be escorted by Matt 
Gutierrez; Irma Tobar, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jose Tobar, who will be 
escorted by Danny Moran.

The Homecoming Dance will be 
held Saturday night at 8:00 P.M. at 
the Civic Center. The music will be 
provided by “Night Rage’’ from San 
Angelo. All Ozona High School stu­
dents, their dates, and any Ozona

have Tuesday 
night meeting

The Lion Booster Club held its 
meeting Sept. 14th. The O.H.S. 
Cheerleaders and the Jr. & Sr. football 
players and managers were all intro­
duced. Next Tuesday the Freshman & 
Sophomore football players will be 
there then the following week Sept. 
18th will be at O.J.H.S. Football team 
and cheerleaders.

Everyone is welcome to come and 
bring a friend. Booster membership is 
still available. $5.00 family and $10.00 
membership. So everyone come out 
and support the Lions in all their 
activities.
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Women of the 80's
Hie program, aimed at the women of lege Station; Rachel Hall, Crockett 
today, eq|oyed a modest crowd at the County Extension Agent and Jan 
Civic Center last Tuesday evening. North, Home Economics teacher at 
Giving demonstrations and lectures Ozona High School. Another program 
were Nancy Granovsky, Family Re- was scheduled for last night, 
source Management Specialist of Col-
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HI6HLI6HTS
By Lyndell WiHiamt 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

AUSTIN—Gov. Mark White last 
week scored an historical first with 
a newly appointed Secretary of State.

Ending much speculation White 
named Myra McDaniel, his former 
general counsel, to the post vacated 
by long-time ally John Fainter. Mc­
Daniel is the first black ever and the 
first woman in 51 years to serve as 
Secretary of State.

Just a week ago, former Secretary 
of State George Strake, who served 
under Republican Gov. Bill Clem­
ents, criticized White for allowing 
the secretary of state’s office to pro­
pose a 36 percent budget hike for 
itself after White had told state agen­
cies to hold down spending requests.

Now state chairman of the Texas 
Republican Party, Strake hit the 
budget for seeking 64 new employ­
ees and a 381 percent increase in 
professional fees.

But acting secretary Ed Davis said 
Strake had targeted their highest 
funding level for political reasons, 
and said a good deal of the budget 
was actually going to help Strake’s 
party.

More than $3 million is desig­
nated to pay for party primaries, 
with about 85 percent going to 
Republicans because of their growth

Water Plan
A key senator from arid West 

Texas told Texas water administra­
tion officials to quit talking and do 
something about water problems.

John Montford, D-Lubbock, called 
the latest water plan report “jibber- 
jabber”, and criticized it for not 
providing for agriculture needs.

When the plan’s architect de­
fended it by questioning the avail­
ability of $40 billion over the next 
20 years for state water-related im­
provements, Montford speculated 
that the current drought might 
prompt legislators to act.

Drought>Resistant?
Speaking of the drought. State 

Rep. Dudley Harrision, D-Sander- 
son, says the livestock which is sur­
viving in West Texas may be a more 
drought-resistant strain.

When his new lambs were sold 
many weighed over 50 pounds, 
“which isn’t too bad considering 
how livestock out here has had to 
cope with the drought’’, he said

Harrison said he was both sur­
prised and hopeful that a healthy 
new stock was emerging from the 
costly dry spell.

Monday
Spanish Steak 
Buttered Corn 
Combination Salad 
Pear Half 
Cornbread 

Tuesday
Hamburger on Bun 
Tater Tots
Lettuce, Tomatoes, Pickles 
Applesauce

Wednesday
Tacos
Pinto Beans 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Peaches 
Cookies

OZONA
PUBUC

SCHOOLS

Thursday
Spaghetti & Meat Sauce 
Buttered Peas 
Vegetable Salad 
Mixed Fruit 
Hut Rolls 

Friday 
Fish Sticks 
Ma.shcd I'otulocs 
Green Beans 
Cuke & .folio 
Hot Rolls

Denvxrdtic
Coraedion.

OiariteiW kf Htrirngt

Converting Wasteland
Fresh back from Israel where he 

inspected large-scale projects to en­
hance water in agricultural waste­
lands, Texas Land Commissioner 
Garry Mauro is negotiating with 
Israeli consultants to bring their 
techniques to arid West Texas.

Mauro’s office manages more 
than 800,000 acres of public land in 
West Texas, and if the price is not 
excessive, he may promote pilot 
projects for various types of irriga­
tion and water recovery.

A spokesman said the Israeli en­
gineering consultants are recognized 
world experts in agricultural produc­
tion in arid lands.

Spouse Immunity
Texas Atty. Gen. Jim Mattox last 

week urged legislators fight child 
abuse by eliminating a spouse’s im­
munity from testimony in cases of 
assault or violence against a family 
member.

The present law is a major obsta­
cle to the successful prosecution of 
child abuse, Mattox told a joint 
panel on child abuse and pornog­
raphy.

“Spouses cannot testify against 
each other in several cases, even 
when they want to, because tfie law 
prevents it.’’

Public Works BiU
Sen. Hector Uribe of Brownsville, 

is planning to introduce a state pub­
lic works bill in the coming session 
to relieve a Rio Grande Valley econ­
omy still facing high unemployment.

The measure was passed by the 
Senate in this summer’s special ses­
sion, but time ran out before the 
House could consider it.

The bill sets up a fund which 
could be used in areas of chronic 
unemployment caused by natural or 
economic disaster

Bullock Report
A prediction from State Comp­

troller Bob Bullock last week viewed 
the Gulf Coast as the Texas eco­
nomic powerhouse for state govern­
ment coffers.

Bullock said the economies of 
Dallas and Austin were diversifying 
and would soon catch up.

West Texas, of course, led in tax 
revenues paid from oil and gas 
production.
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A rc-run of 

“ The O/.ona Story”  
ar. gleaned from 

the Hies of the 
ITie O/.ona Stockman'

Thursday, Sept. 15, 1955
Mr. and Mrs. Basil Dunlap are the 

parents of a daughter born Aug. 27 in 
Crockett County Hospital. The baby 
has been named Bridget and weighed 
8 pounds 15 ounces.

29 yrs. ago
Brock Jones of Ozona, a member of 

the Concho Valley Council executive 
committee was host at a barbecue 
supper Monday night to which local 
Boy Scout leaders and others inter­
ested were invited.

29 yrs. ago
Coach Pete Hickman and Coach 

Sonny Cleere have found themselves 
with a small squad both physically and 
in number but have been encouraged 
by the squad’s spirit and willingness. 
In spite of the lack of size the Lions 
will field a hard hitting team that 
boasts 14 seniors among its some 
eighteen first line performers.

29 yrs. ago
Mrs. Wilma Friend joined the 

Stockman staff.
29 yrs. ago

Mrs. Max Schneemann Sr. pres­
ident of Ozona’s Annual Homecoming 
Event this year announced this week 
that plans are being made to hold the 
affair on Oct. 8. Cayce Moore will be 
guest speaker for the occasion. Along 
with the program a football game has 
been scheduled to be played with 
Rankin here in Lion Stadium on Oct. 7.

29 yrs. ago
School enrollment was up slightly. 

The total enrollment figures for the 
high school, junior high and two 
elementary schools was 819.

29 yrs. ago
Mr. and Mrs. Martin Dowdy are 

parents of a daughter. The baby 
weighed 7 pounds 6 ounces and was 
named Oleta Mae. She was born Sept. 
4.

29 yrs. ago
Mrs. Gladys Cox, an Ozona tele­

phone operator has been chosen to 
receive the LaCroix Certificate of 
Meritorious Service one of the high 
awards for heroic service available to 
telephone company employees. The 
award is given for service during the 
flood.

29 yrs. ago
Miss Evelyn Way of Texon became 

the bride of William Schneemann III.
29 yrs. ago

Mrs. Charles Williams Sr. was 
honored recently with a birthday party 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Williams Jr.

29 yrs. ago
Mrs. James Baggett announced the 

first meeting of the new year for the 
PTA will be held Sept. 19.

29 yrs. ago
SCS crew arrives to begin Johnson 

watershed survey.
29 yrs. ago

9th Annual 4-H Livestock Show has 
been set for Jan. 7.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona’s annual P.T.A. Carnival will 

be Sept. 20, Mrs. Ele Hagelstein, 
carnival chairman announced.

29 yrs. ago
Second grade Brownies met and 
organized this week. New leaders are 
Mrs. Bud Coates and Mrs. Ross 
Beardmore.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Woman’s Club honored thier 

past presidents with a luncheon in the 
home of Mrs. S.M. Harvick. 20 past 
presidents were honored.

29 yrs. ago
Members of the Jenny King Circle 

of the Methodist WSCS met with Mrs. 
Victor Pierce.

29 yrs. ago
The school faculty was honored at 

First Baptist with a barbecue supper.
29 yrs. ago

Mrs. Dorothy Montgomery an­
nounced the beginning of classes in 
ballroom dancing.

29 yrs. ago
Woman’s Forum opened the new 

club year with a breadfast at the 
House of Flowers, Saturday.

HERI1PGE
NEW6
FORUM

F R O M  H E R IT A G E  F E A T U R E S  S Y N D IC A T E W A S H IN G T O N . D C.

SOCIAL SECURITY, AGAIN
By Edwin Feulner

Some White House political pros got a real bad case of the jitters 
recently when President Reagan suggested that many young workers 
entering the job market probably won’t get back from Social Security 
everything they and their employers pay into the system.

You just don’t talk about Social Security in an election year was the 
message — recalling what Barry Goldwater’s candor on the subject did 
for his campaign 20 years ago.

House Speaker Thomas P “ Tip” O’Neill was quick to jump on the 
president, and trotted out some tired old warhorses from the past who 
ritualistically declared the president all wet

The only trouble is, the president is right. It's Speaker O’Neill who 
needs the toweling.

Despite disclaimers from a variety of “ experts,” most of them involved 
in creating the current Social Security mess, research done by Peter Ferrara 
for The Heritage Foundation clearly indicates that young workers will be 
lucky to break even when they retire.

Ferrara, a former senior staff member in the White House Office of 
Policy Development, is realistic enough to know that the Social Security 
system is not going to be rebuilt overnight. Nor, in fact, is it probably 
going to be tinkered with at all. Not now, anyway.

So perhaps now is the best time to try for second best; to set'the record 
straight, and let the Baby Boom and post-Daby Hoorn generations know 
what a “ great deal” is in store for them.

We might even start planning for the day when the Pepsi Generation 
starts thinking Geritol and demands changes in the government pension 
plan. I can assure you that day will come, and it’s probably not that far 
off.

Ferrara, in his latest paper on the subject, profK)ses that we lay the 
groundwork now for the work that inevitably lies ahead. Not by tampering 
with Social Security Congress won’t touch it, so why bother?

Instead, Ferrara suggests the following:
1) That the maximum tax-deductible contribution to an Individual 

Retirement Account (IRA) he raised to equal the maximum employee
contribution” to Social Security. This would raise the max from $2,000 

to about $2.6(K)
2) Raise the maximum IRA contribution a non-working spouse can 

make from the present $250 to the same max allowed working people.
3) Indexing the maximum IRA contribution allowed, so it will 

automatically increase at the same rate Social Security increases.
4) Allowing individuals to apply a portion of their IRA contributions 

to the purcha.se of life, disability, and retirement health insurance.
Modest steps, these But taken together they would mean that when 

the inevitable happens, a retirement program paralleling Swial Security 
will already be in place

Ferrara also suggests what might be called a “ Truth-in-Packaging” 
law for StKial Security: requiring the StK'ial Security Administration to: 
(ai publish each year an estimate of the rate of return on Social Security 
contributions: and (b) furnish each worker with a “ Statement of Account,” 
indicating his or her contributions for the year and the anticipated rate 
ot return under current law In addition, he wants the employer’s share 
of the payroll tax to be reported on each worker’s paycheck, as well as 
the amount of employee payroll tax withheld, and what kinds of coverage 
are being provided This would “ help workers understand the full amounts 
being paid for their Social Security benefits and enable them to compare 
more easily what they could obtain for the same funds in the private sector. ”

It would also help workers recognize how much of their money is 
going into portions of the program for which they are not eligible, such 
as single workers paying for Social Security survivors insurance.

Tip O’Neill notwithstanding. Social Security is a bad deal for the Baby 
B(H)mers and post-Baby Burners. And it will become a worse deal. The 
least we can do is require the government to tell it to us straight.

(Feulner is president of The Heritage Foundation, a Washington-based 
public policy research institute.)

o o o o o o o o o o o o o o c x s > o o o o o o o o o

Letters To The Editor
September 4,1984

Dear Ms. Montgomery:
Your readers will see big changes in 

their state taxes beginning October 2. 
This summer the State Legislature 
raised the rates for sales tax and a 
number of other state taxes. They also 
extended the sales tax to items and 
services that have been exempt in the 
past.

The enclosed package of news 
releases is designed to insure that 
these tax changes won’t come as an 
unpleasant surprise the morning of 
October 2.

I’ve come to you in the past to ask 
your help in getting the word out 
about state taxes to your readers and 
you’ve never let me down. I’m asking 
your help again in getting started on 
the collection of the biggest tax bill in 
the history of our state or anybody 
else’s.

Thank you in advance for your help. 
If you need further infcnmiation or 
need answers to the questions sure to

arise about the details of all these 
changes, you can get quick answers by 
calling our toll-free tax hotline at 
1-800-252-5555.

Sincerely,
Bob Bullock
Comptroller of Public Accounts 
Austin, Texas 78774

S^tem ber 10,1984
Dear Supporters of Crockett County:

Thank you for your support by your 
attendance at the Helping Hands For 
The Elderly’s benefit B-B-Q. Your 
donations of time and money will 
serve to support our senior citizens of 
Crockett County.

Our senior citizens will always be 
with us and by your support they will 
learn just how much they are loved 
and appreciated.

Again, we at Helping Hands and the 
Senior Citizens appreciate your sup­
port.

Sincerely,
The Directors of Helping Hands
For The Elderly

Ozona
Business

And
Professional

Guide

OZONA DAY CARE CENTER 
Methodist Church 

Phone 392-3641
Birth to 13 yrs.-FoUtime or drop-tn

VILLAGE BARBER SHOP 
Regular Haircuts 

Razor Cuts-Layer Cuts and 
Men’s Hair Styling 

Jim Caldwell
WHITEHOUSE CO.

GULF PRODUCTS 
Hunting Supplies, Deer Leases 

Ph. 392-3912,705-llth St. 
6:00 a.m.-10:00 p.m.

MAXINE’S FLOWER SHOP 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

CAMERAS TWO 
Photogn^hy and Frame Shop 

404Ave.J 392-2256

VFW POST 6109 
Regular Meetings Third Tuesday 

In Each Month-8:00 p.m.

OZONA BUTANE CO. 
Propane Gas-Sales and Service 

llOSAve.E Ph. 392-3013

THE LINE 
Party Merchant

14 Mi. E o ff I-IO Ph. 387-2956 
Beer-Liquor-Wine

THE BAGGETT AGENCY 
Insurance

Your Protection is our Profession 
1114Ave.E 392-2606

‘Everything for the Home’ 
at

BROWN FURNITURE CO. 
906 Ave. E Ph. 392-2341

J.W. MOTOR PARTS 
Auto Parts & Supplies 

60611th St. 392-2343

OZONA LODGE 747 
Slated meetlngs-flrst Mon. of 

month, 7:30 p.m.
Study-each Thursday

POTTER’S WHEEL CERAMICS 
104A Live Oak Drive 

Ph. 392-2548 
Hrs. 1-5, Mon.-Fri.

SKAIN’S GARAGE 
Welding &  General Repair 

24 Hr. Wrecker Service 
392-3110 or 392-3505

CARPET CARE 
Residential & Commercial

Carpet & Upholstery cleaning 
Also auto upholstery cleaning 

Ph. 392-3879

HRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Dr. S.N. Lanham, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 
Evening Worship 7:00 

Prayer Service Wed. 7:30

SPORT SHACK 
T-Shirts-Transfers 

Deer Leases 
1102 Ave. I 392-3382

B&C AUTOMOTIVE 
Complete Auto Repair 

& Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 403-lst St.

WANTED
All singles to attend the growing 

singles class-FIrst Baptist Church 
Sunday-9:45 a.m.

DALE’S ELECTRIC 
Residential-Commercial 
Oilfield Trouble Shooting 

Ditch Witch, Berkely Pumps 
Dale Hobson, owner-1108 Ave. J 

[9151392-2801 25-tfc

COPIES
Reduce or enlarge 

Invitations Flyers
PERRY PHOTOGRAPHY 

9th & Ave. H 392-25228

C&D ROOFING
Call for Free Inspection & Estimate 
Duane Drew Steve Conley
949-2269 San Angelo 949-3398 

27-12tp

THIS SPACE AVAILABLE 
$2.50 WEEKLY

THIS SPACE AVAILABLE 
$2.50 WEEKLY
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Jim's
Foodway

12 Pack
1 2 -O Z .

Cans
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You Always Get More
SPECIAL SA/I4G S SUPER SERVICE

PRICES EFFECTIVE THURSDAY. SEPT. 13th thru MONDAY,' SEPTEMBER 17 1984

LIMIT RIGHTS RESERVED ^̂ GRAIN FED”  BEEF
BONELESS

CHUCK
STEAK

"GRAI
FED”
BEEF

PERSONALLY
SELECTED

"BREAKFAST FAVORITT

0 S U C E D
BACON BCHUCK ROAST

B O N E L E S S  “G R A IN  F E D ” B E EF

SHOULDER ROAST
G U A R A N T E E D  Q U A L IT Y

—  PATTIES BOX

$149

^ T u r k e y  h a lf  H A M S ^B ^r^ LB.
PERSONALLY

SELECTED

I FRANKS

1 2 -O Z
P K G . X i

CHUCK QUALITY
If r e s h  l e a n

GROUND
BEEF

VM. i- 
hAM

ALL PURPOSE

GLADIOLA
FLOUR

FLOUR
‘m m z ::

LEAN AND 
TENDER

S T EW IN G
B EEF

"HUSBAND P L E A S ir

RANCH STYLE 
BEANS

2*1
CANS m

Fleming All Grinds o n e  l b .

A S S O R T E D  F L A V O R S

SHASTA SOFT DRINKS

$019 A S S O R T E D  R E G U L A R  O R  S U P E R  A B S O R B E N T
•SMALL Y O U R

C H O IC E

BANNER ASSORTED

Bathroom Tissue
B onus Pack

Purina Dog Chow
S u n s h in e ■- wiHCoa
Pimentos
R eyn o ld s

Aluminum Foil

4 -R o ll
Pkg.

3 0 -L b .
B ag

4 -O z .
Jar

2 5 -S q . 
Ft. R o ll

W A  A  t re e  lo p

^8 9  Apple Juice
A  A  Sports Series 16-O z. Size7̂̂  D ixie Cups

mm ^  9 -in c h  W h ite

.7 9  D ixie Plates
mm C oncentrated  $1.50 O F F  LABEI

.6 5  All Detergent Fam ily  
S ize  Box

6
$159

.8 9
$109

n r

4 8 -O z .
Btl.

Pkg. 
of 18

Pkg. 
of 100

FINEST ALL'VEGETABLE ^  _

f^ lsc p  i j .  $ 2 ^ ^

PAMPERS DIAPERS IE *
(jcR A F ^m?l JELLY
D eodo ran t 10<P O F F  LA B EL a

Shield Soap \3 9
D ishw ashing D eterg ent 20<t O FF  LA B EL ' *  ^  a a

Sun Ught Uquid ^  U ”
Liquid C leaner 25C O FF  LA B E L a  ^

Top Job it“ U ”
N ew  Fabric Softener 60C O F F  LA B EL a  a ^ a  _

Downy PICKLES 32 o z

3 2 -O Z .

3L B .
CAN

HAMBURGER SLICED $109

CALIFORNIA SWEET

CANTALOUPE

C A L IF O R N IA

CELERY 3  S T A L K S
C A L IF O R N IA  C R E A M Y  H A S S ^  *  .

AVOCADOS 3 .OB 4
S N O -W H IT E  C O U N T R Y  S T A N D  _ ^

MUSHROOMS P K G . .9 9
Fresh C a lifo rn ia

W iiow Onions Lb .2 3
n Red Potatoes Subs ^1

Green Onions
CELLO

Carrots 3
B unch

BUNCHES

ASSORTED

MORTON 
POT PIES

•CNW KENMTUMEYMiaF

GOOD VALUE

MARGARINE
QUARTERS

1-LB.
CTNS.

02
i'T

F R O Z E N  A S S O R T E D

MORTON DINNERS
^  H O M E S T Y L E  O R  B U T T E R M IL K

I S  BISCUITS

1 0 -O Z .
C T N .

5
M o rto n A  B orden W rapp ed Singles

*2*^ Sliced Cheese
m ^  A A  B lue  B o n n e t

Spread
Fried Chicken
M o rto n  M in i

Honeybuns
G ood Value Frozen

W affles

2-L b .
C tn .

T U B E S

12-oz.
FOOD Pkg

3-L b .
B ow l

5 -O z .
B oxes

M ild or M edium  C hedd ar

Cheese Stick 8 -O z
Stick

I j ^ i  Snearsa°'.59

916 ll»SrREET 020NA,TEX’'?.S“ 3S lf f i ! S r  \
..  HOME OWNED GOPEIUm D CLOSED SUraMY

tlNITEQ
SUPEJiS
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Wips For Gardeners
^  From (he
SŜ Ozona Garden Club

by Mrs. Bailey Post
^-nrTTvrrrTTTTrrvrrTTTrTvrrTTTr

I’m sure everyone was elated over 
: ^ e  showers we had last week, so we 
^ r e  hoping others will follow to green 

our country before fall.
§  If you haven’t driven around our city 
irately, do go to see the beautiful 
'^pampas grass plumes in a number of 
^ards. If you plan to cure them for 
tlater use, be sure to cut them just as 
ithey are about half open and especial­
l y  if it looks like rain which causes 
Ithem to look stringy.

Another early autumn evergreen 
^ o u  will enjoy and perhaps want to 
^ la n t  this fall is the scarlet firethorn 
i^ften known as pyracantha. It can be 
'Counted on for fast, vigorous growth- 
Ssomething you will have to consider 
jjwhen choosing a location. It can be 
^ n e  of fall’s most striking omamen- 
:X;ials. Also bird lovers have a special 
J^ ea t in store each autumn, as the 
J^erries are a favorite of many species, 
including cedar waxwings, tanagers, 
.irratbirds, and purple finches. Also 
Inhere will be a blanket of blossoms 
j^that covers scarlet firethorn for two 
^weeks in springtime. These plants 
jSsprawling look is due to a spreading, 
'irregular growth habit, sending out 
S^ong branches. So don’t be deceived 
^^y the small specimen you may see at 
^ h e  nursery. If planted in a confined 
§;area, you may soon have a large 
^problem. Located in an area at least 10 
&feet square, it only needs occasion- 
I^al pruning to remove a wild limb or 
^dead wood. If you choose, its branches 
^also espalier well on a wall. Among 
Si t̂he selections to choose fi'om the most 
^popular are Kasan and Wyatter 
^(orange-red berries) and Lalandei 
^(orange berries). Lowboy (orangeber- 
5^ries) features a different habit of 
cigrowth. Instead of sprawling, this 

plant mounds to a height of 3 to 4 feet. 
^T o  maintain the lustrous green foliage 

fertilize firethorn in early spring and 
C: late fall with Vi cup of 5-10-10 per 
;{ plant.

Promote better fall blooms on roses 
^  by lightly trimming this month and 

feed with a water-soluble rose fertili- 
S  zer.

Cattails are ready to gather. Spray 
with hair spray, place in upright 

^  container to air out for dried arr- 
angements.
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Mrs. Friend
I is luncheon

su

¥
S  PHONE NEWS TO THE STOCK- 
K  MAN.

CECIL W ESTE R M A N  

Would 

Uke 

To

Be
YOUR 
PHARMACIST

PH 392-2608

OZONA 
CHURCH OF 

CHRIST
110211th Ozona

Sunday Morning Gass 
9:45

Sunday Morning Worship 
10:50 •

Sunday Evening Worship 
6:30

Wednesday Evening 
Class 

--------  7:00
RALPH ANDERSON 

Minister
Serving.Christ By 

Serving Yoa

I C L O G G E D  P IP E S , 
I D R A IN S , SE W E R S
NOdigging NOdamage

1206 Ave. F.
Raul DeLaRosa

Plumbing i  Serv. 
Ditch Digging

Sorority in 
first meet of 
new club year

Seconds and irregulars can 
save dollars for consumers

Crockett Heights homemakers 
Club meets in Karr home

The Alpha Alpha Mu Chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi held the first regular 
meeting for this year Monday night in 
the home of Marcy Williams. Hostess­
es for the meeting were Rhonda Shaw 
and Leslie Wilson.

Elizabeth Upham presented a very 
informative program on insurance. 
She covered a wide range of topics, 
explaining the different types, values, 
advantages and disadvantages of var­
ious insurance policies including life, 
health and homeowners.

Following the program, a meeting 
was held to discuss program topics for 
the coming year and the upcoming 
Girls Rush Party to be held on 
September 24. Marcy Williams was 
appointed as yardstick chairman for 
1984-85.

Members then enjoyed refresh­
ments and exchanged Secret Sister 
gifts.

Present were Dena Porter, Philda 
Morrison, Nesa Chandler, Jeannine 
Henderson, Rita Sigwing, Marilyn 
Armentrout, Tammy Bunger, Leslie 
Reeves, Ellen Lipsey, Lori Parker, 
Becky Dillard, Marcy Williams, Rhon­
da Shaw, Leslie Wilson, Debbie 
Glasscock, Melissa Hintz, Roylan 
Sullivan and Karen Huffman.

bridge hostess
Mrs. "Joe Friend was hostess for 

luncheon and bridge at the Country 
Club Thursday.

Mrs. Sonny Bailey won high and 
Mrs. Sherman Taylor, second high. 
Mrs. George Bunger won the bingo.

Others playing were Mrs. Clay 
Adams, Mrs. Bud Cox, Mrs. Hugh 
Childress, Mrs. Joe Couch, Mrs. John 
R. Hunnicutt, Mrs. J. J. Marley, Mrs. 
Bill Mason, Mrs. J. B. Parker, Mrs. 
Jake Short, Mrs. Sherman Taylor, 
Mrs. C. O. Walker, Mrs. Sidney 
Millspaugh, Mrs. Charles Williams, 
Mrs. Byron Williams, Mrs. Gene 
Williams, Mrs. Jack Williams and 
Mrs. Bill Baggett.

Dutch brunch 
kicks off club 
year for Forum

The program committee hosted the 
first fall meeting of the Ozona Wom­
an’s Forum which met Sept. 8 at 10:30 
a.m. in the Circle Bar Dining Room for 
a Dutch Brunch with thirty members 
attending.

Following the meal, the year books 
were distributed and the upcoming 
programs were previewed.

After^a brief business session, the 
meeting was adjourned.

Those present were Vera Dell Allen, 
Jane Black, Lillian Brown, Louise 
Bunger, Crystelle Childress, Rachel 
Childress, Arlene Clayton, Elizabeth 
Dudley, Mary Hagelstein, Totsy Hag- 
elstein, Mayde Jo Humpheries, Lu 
Ingram, Bernice Jones, Katy Jones, 
Mary Lee Jones, Georgia Kirby, Lois 
Lock, Velma Marley, Pauline Mont­
gomery, Doris Moore, Louisa Pear­
son, Nora Lu Spencer, Madeline 
Stokes, Blanche Walker, Barbara Wal­
lace, Mary Agnes Ward, Bonnie 
Warth, Modene Whitaker and Jewel 
Bailey.

Sorority hosts 
families at 
annual supper

The Alpha Alpha Mu Chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi kicked off the new 
year on Thursday, August 30.

A hamburger supper was hosted by 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Wilson for 
sorority members, husbands and chil­
dren.

Members and their husbands enjoy­
ed an evening of socializing out­
doors while the children played ping- 
pong and jumped on the trampoline.

Those present were the Wilsons, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Glasscock and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Jason Sulli­
van and children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Morrison and Jarrod, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tony Renfro and children, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Armentrout and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Shaw 
and Rebecca, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Chandler, Mr. and Mrs. Vince Huff­
man, Mr. and Mrs. Murray Hintz, 
Marcy Williams, Becky Dillard, Jean- 
nine Henderson, Lisa Waggoner, Rita 
Sigwing and Dena Porter.

Careful shoppers for seconds and 
irregulars can save consumers mon­
ey, if they know how to look for signs 
of quality, says a Texas A&M 
University Agricultural Extension 
Service home economist.

Many manufacturers set stan­
dards for their products, says Bonnie 
L. Piernot. When those standards 
aren’t met, they don’t discard the 
items. Instead, manufacturers label 
the imperfect product a “ second” or 
an “ irregular” and direct stores to 
sell it below regular retail price, she 
explains.

New club year 
for Pandale 
Study Club

The first meeting of the 1984-85 
club year for the Pandale Study Club 
was held Thursday, September 6 at 
the Pandale Community Center. Vice 
President Lara Sue Baggett presided 
in the absence of the President, Lou 
Deaton.

Barbara Malone, Secretary-Treasu­
rer, reported that cookbook sales had 
been profitable during the summer 
and that more cookbooks had been 
ordered and should arrive in the next 
few weeks.

Annual allottments to San Angelo 
Volunteer Council, Boy’s Ranch, and 
High Sky Girl’s Ranch were approved 
with a one time increase to High Sky 
Girl’s Ranch due to unforseen finan­
cial difficulties there.

Discussion of the format and con­
tents of the “ Pandale Memory Book” 
were discussed with an outline being 
prepared by Barbara Malone to be 
ready for the October meeting.

Hostesses Ginger Pemer and Von- 
nie Womack served a refreshing fi'uit 
salad, with shortbread cookies, tea 
and coffee to members Sue Arledge, 
Lara Sue Baggett, Lela Bunger, Opal 
Everett, Barbara Malone, Josephine 
Mills, Judy Nasworthy, Jessie White 
and guest Tammy Bunger of Ozona.

Submitted by 
Sue Arledge, Reporter

A factory irregular is usually only 
slightly below the manufacturer’s 
standards, says the home econo­
mist. Irregular stockings, for exam­
ple, may be not quite standard size. 
Irregular towels may be not quite 
perfect in color or weave and jthere 
may be a slight oil spot on an 
irregular shirt.

“Often you won’t be able to spot 
the defect in a factory irregular,” 
says Piernot.

In general, you’re more likely to 
find damaged goods among products 
labeled as seconds, she observes. A 
second is often broken, tom or poorly 
made and the defect is easily 
identified.

But it can pay to carefully exam­
ine seconds, says Piernot, because 
sometimes they are perfect. Occa­
sionally a company wants to clear out 
some goods at sale prices without 
having to lower prices on similar 
items. So the company calls the 
goods seconds and sells them at a 
lower price.

To get irregulars or seconds that 
meet their needs, consumers should 
determine the marks of quality for 
the product they’re buying, advises 
the home economist.

Whether the product is a kitchen 
appliance, sweater or carpet, there 
are specific indicators of quality that 
can guide the purchase decision, she 
points out. Reading about the pro­
duct in consumer books or maga­
zines and comparison shopping in 
person or by catalog can help 
consumers discern these quality 
features.
DUPUCATE BRU)GE

Saturday afternoon Duplicate 
Bridge Club play was held at the home 
of Mrs. Gene Lilly. Mrs. Lilly and 
Mrs. Clay Adams claimed the top 
spot. Second went to Mrs. Gene 
Williams and Mrs. Byron Williams 
and third to Mrs. Kirby Moore and 
Mrs. George Bunger.

In play Sunday at the Country Club, 
Mrs. Lilly and Mrs. Adams were first 
again, followed by Mrs. Evart White 
and Mrs. Sidney Millspaugh in second 
and Mrs. Jack Williams and Mrs. Bill 
Baggett, third.

Monday, September 10, the Crock­
ett Heights Homemaker Club met at 
the home of Doris Karr.

Led by Rachel Hall, Crockett County 
Extension Agent, the group elected 
Polly Mayes and Charlotte Trull as 
co-chairmen for the upcoming year. 
Program suggestions were discussed 
for future meetings.

Also, an announcement was made 
by Mrs. Hall concerning the state 
meeting of the Texas Extension 
Homemaker Association to be held in 
San Angelo September 19-20.

The meeting concluded with ar­
rangements for Mrs. Hall, Mrs. 
Mayes, and Mrs. Trull to meet 
Tuesday, Sept. 18, to draft a year­

book and to make final decisions for 
program topics.

Enjoying this meeting were Doris 
Karr, Polly Mayes, Charlotte Trull, 
Roberta Schoenhals, Goldia Kilgore, 
Hazel Storms, Kim Hager and Rachel 
Hall.

HAYES
AUTO

REPAIR
Mechanic On Duty 

8 a.m.-6 p.m. 
1311 Ave. AA 
Phone 392-3224

/ / When the beach 
is out of re a c h /'

Pat Walker's Figure Salon offers mS U N T A N A  
SUN SYSTEM 

(Suntan Bed)
for that beautiful year round tan. 

Just lay and relax -  No boiling Sun.

^ _ N o w  thro Sept. 30th
Get V2 o ff 

reg. price on any
° "iroTAv°/A  ̂ block.

Try it you'll like it i
8:00 a.m.

MICHELLE PEARLETTA MAYDE .IQ_________fO 8 : 0 0 p . m .

PHONE (9 1 5 ) 392-3706 
OZONA, TEXA*^ 76943

Texas mothers fT 
have lowest 
birth rate in 83

Texas mothers recorded 295,178 
births in 1983 for a birth rate of 18.8 
per 1,000 population. This is the 
lowest birth rate since 1978, reports 
the Bureau of Vital Statistics of the 
Texas Department of Health.

Even though the population of 
Texas continued to increase last year, 
the birth rate was a decrease from the 
1982 rate of 19.5 when 297,683 births 
were registered.

Last year physicians were in atten­
dance at 284,091 births (96.2 percent), 
while midwives and others were in 
attendance at 11,087 births. Births in 
hospitals totalled 284,973 (96.5 per­
cent).

Couples golf 
winners told

Winners in Couples Golf at the 
Ozona Country Club Tuesday were 
Randy and Eddy Hall and Tommy and 
Christ! Matthews.

Second and third places ended in a 
tie between the teams of Weldoh and 
Cindy Nicks, Dick and Mary Web­
ster; Pete and Jimmie Jacoby and 
Glenn Graham and Debbie Glasscock.

Gosest to the pin were Perry 
Williams and Jimmie Jacoby.

1985 CALENDAR REHELS NOW 
AVAILABLE AT THE STOCKMAN.

The. F o o t  
Nore i r* » '5 v s

H e re ̂ TheyV'
C o M p ( e + e  y e a r  w a M r o b e  + h i «  

t A C M T h  w i T h  T h e  ^ s h i o N
+ e N N i s  s h o e s .  O u s t  - F o r  a w y
o c c a s i O N .  C o i ^ p U N \ e N T  y o a . r  s h o e s  
W i t h  o u r  l a t e s t  s e l e c t  i o n  o t  s o c k s  
• f o r  w o f A e N  a n d  cM\ I d r e N  • f r o r A  A . -  
F e e T  ' A h e a d  , c ivou  I a b l e  iN  S o l to L c o io rs  
O L n d |^ r iN j | f 'S .  ^ ka€  b y  a n d  s t e p  o u t

^  L d i d i e t s  SIZES 5 - / 0

Lo tto  ^ .  „ „
L o g o s

OzoMA ViIIase S h ^ iN O  C enter

Ripples do not move water— they are only the marks of a momen­
tary disturbance Neat, orderly, symetrical as they appear— they're 
just the remains of a splash

How often we've tried to make waves and they turned out to be 
merely ripples Our efforts brought no new flow of thought or action 
We simply interrupted the tranquility Or was it the stagnation'^

There are new currents stirring today— positive, refreshing hope­
ful currents There are reverent, responsive people who believe it can 
become a better world

Why don't you join the folks who are tired of making ripples 
who when they see a need or a problem plunge in to help"?

You'll find many such people exploring the spiritual wells and 
springs. Their earnestness and enthusiasm is giving renewed energy 
to our churches They would like to share with you their Christian 
opportunities and challenges

Scriptures selected by 
Th e  American Bible Society C o p y r ig h t 1982 K e is te r A d ve rtis in g  S e rv ice  

P O  B ox  8024 , C h a n o tte sv ille  V irg in ia  22 9 0 6

Sunday M onday Tuesday W ed nesday Thursday Friday Saturday
M atthew R om ans 1 Corinthians Ephesians Philippians H ebrew s H ebrew s
5:43-48 12 :9-18 13 :1 -13 4 :1 7 -3 2 4:5 -13 6 :9 -12 10 :19 -39

t  ^  t  <si2? t  W  t  <22? t  <22? t  <22? t  <22? t  <2? t  ^

This series of ads is being published and sponsored by the Ozona 

business firms in the interest of a stronger community,
Ozona National Bank

Ozona Butane Co. 
Jim's Foodway 
Brown Furniture

White's Auto 
South Texas Lmbr. Co. 
Ozono TV System

Crockett County Notional Bonk
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P iA Y PAUAS e o m n r
PSO-FOOTBAU

xrm m m n
^A^UK. A^AAyMAA\y^/^^

ELEGANT H
S D U N L E S S  I 
l A B tE M A E

wovarcwN '
jonaAtE I

NGWI I

Grade A medfum ^
SHURFRESH EGGS

00
M.I  ' I

Dozen 2
LIMIT 4 DOZ. PLEASE

32 OZ. 
BTL.

FRESHLY GROUND 
73%  LEAN GUARANTEED

FAJITAS
$189

6 9
iSDA M A N  A R B M  BRiSSD n i T »

CUT PAN READY WHOLE

FRYERS
FRESH SPLIT FRYER a m

BREASTS LB
FRESH FRYER a  ■  n 0

THWHS LB
FRESH FRYER ^  ^

WILSON

FRA N KS
KAHN H A M S $
BONELESS 179

LB. 12 OZ.

WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED SLICED

c S lA B  BACON
$139

Contodina

I
8 OZ. 
CANS 5/88

NEWI DUNCAN HINES ASSORTED
12 OZ. 
PK6.

SNACK SIZE MILKY WAY, 
SNICKERS, 3 MUSKETEERS

CANDY BARI
m m : - -

CASSEROLE

PINTO BEANS

$119
u p n w  u.S. #1 "

AVOCADOS^ 1̂

10 LB. 
BAG

C a lifo rn io  C o ts le m o n
PLUMS

GROCERY SPECIALS

TEXAS

BREEN
CABBABE 1 0 ‘
CALIFORNIA NEW CROP RED DELICIOUS

.  4 9 ‘APPUS
TEXAS VINE RIPENED

CANTALOUPE .  2 9 *
CALIFORNIA CRISP

CARROTS a  2 9 *
SWEET YEUOW

ONIONS .  1 7 *
.  -  _ V i

4 LB.

LAUNDRY DETERGENT

TIPE
PALMOLIVE 
LIQUID
COHTADIHA

TOMATOES
14’/2
OZ.

CANS 2/.B8
THRIFT KING

SHORTENING
$139

42 O Z .  ■

Dole
PINEAPPLE 2 /8 9

HAMBURGK SLICED DILLS

> VLASK PKKLES 32 OZ. 8 1 29 1 
JAR I

HIDDEN VALLEY ORIGINAL RANCH

DRESSMB uor,S169i
. B T L .  ■ U

20* OFF LABEL- LIPTON

INSTANT TEA 3 o r  $1*9
. JAR I

HBLSHEY MINIATURES OR 14  oZ . PKG.

CHOCOLAn KISSES $29*
Shurfme- e ■ aa i
COFFEE All Grindsib. 1 i

VIENNA SAUSAGE 2 / 8 8 *
D E L  M O N T E

PUDDING SNACKS 4  p k .  y y ^

$ S 9 9

ORE IDA

FROZEN FOOD SPECIALS

CUT OKRA 10 OZ. 
PK6.

MINUTE MAID 10 OZ. REDUaO ACID, 
12 OZ. A60RE PULP, OR REGULAR

JUKE CAN

W INN
Cherry Pie FiUing j i  or' 99 K e eb le r

Vanilla Wafers 12 oz. $ 1 2 9

BEAUTIFUL SAVINGS
VASELINE INTENSIVE CARE

LOTION
$ 2 * 9

YiiiTAillUK^^^^^ BEANS 14 oz. 4 9 ^
• m m DEL MONTE CUT

CORONET BATHROOM

TISSUE 
$169

8 ROLL 
PKG.

CLEANSER

15 OZ. 
BTL.

M INUTE M A ID  I PINK ’ CAN

CHEWABLE TABLETS

CHILDREN'S TYLENOL

B

CAN

1 0  GTS.

Solo 20 c t.
$ 2 5 9  PARTY CUPS

COOL DAIRY BUYS

16 OZ.
SHURFRESH TEXAS STYLE BTRMLK OR

7 “  BISCUITS 12 OZ. 
CAN

SHURFINE
SHURFRESH QUARTERS

CHARCOAL 10 LB. 
BAG

$ |4 9  M A M A R IN E
1 LB. 
PKGS.

Tu«T0^L^0bjgaj^ UO
¥ 1 ^ 0  C O N D IT IO N E R  7 -s e a s  '

BUTTERMILK DRESSING

30 a. 
B U .

.ASSORTED FU VQ R S  DRINK M IX CAN

f MAKES 
8 Q T S .

IS O Z .
BTL.____ ■  Bomo A«|0jr1

Q̂Tips C M M  Jolly or Jam
COnON SWABS SALAD
ANTI-PKSPtRANT REGULAR OR UNSCENTH) m  MM mm

SECRRSOUD IS ^2^* MUSTAKU 16 OZ. 
JARS

PRODUCTS OF

C O C A -C O LA

2 LITER
y

G a n c h ^
Ice C ream

ASSORTED 
FLAVORS

i S w

m m m m
lK X X > S IN C .

MEMBER STORE T m B a
f - I S .  1 9 M

IWffty
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Public Notice
CITATION BY PUBUCATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TOt T.B.A. Partnership, Defendant, 
Greeting:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear by filing a written answer to 
the Plaintiffs Petition at or before 
ten o’clock A.M. of the first Monday 
after the expiration of forty-two days 
from the date of the issuance of this 
citation, same being Monday the 1st 
day of October 1984, at or before ten 
o'clock A.M. before the Honorable 
112th District Court of Crockett 
County. Texas, at the Court House of 
said County in Ozona, Texas.

Said Plaintiffs Petition was filed 
in said court, on the 1st day of 
January A.D. 1984, in this cause, 
numbered 4646 on the docket of said 
court, and styled, Halliburton Com­
pany Plaintiff, vs. Good Earth Ener­
gy, Inc., el al Defendant.

The names of the parties to the 
cause are as follows:

Halliburton Company as Plaintiffs 
and Good F.arth Energy, Inc., Merit 
Gas Sc Oil. TBA Partnership com­
posed of Daniel B. Thomas, Ora 
Boss. Gary Adolf, Indv. & Partn­
ers. Rye Supply Co., Inc., Eicon 
Trucking Inc., rtstleberry Drilling 
Service. Ira Smith. Garrison Con­
tractors. Inc.. Western Company of 
North America. Bell Petroleum Sur­
veys. Inc.. AWS Well Servicing Co. 
Sc Shoreline Supply Company are 
Defendants.

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit IS as follows, to wit: The 
Defendant 1 B.A. Partnership is a 
purported owner of an undivided 
interest in the working interest of the 
Scull Leases, and therefor, their 
interest in said leases is subject to 
foreclosure of Plaintiff's Lien 
Claims.

as is more fully shown by Plain­
tiff s Petition on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served within 
ninety days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served

The officer executing this process 
shall promptiv execute the same 
according to law. and make due 
return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at office 
in 0/ona. Texas, this the 20 day of 
August A.D. 1984.

' [Sm I]
Attest:
Debbi Puckett, Qerk
District Court. Crockett County.
Texas.
By Alice M. Fay Deputy.

26-4tc

CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS
Tot Ora Lee Boss Defendant, Greet­
ing:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear by filing a written answer to 
the Plaintiffs Petition at or before 
ten o'clock A.M. of the first Mon­
day after the expiration of forty- 
tw(» davs from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same being 
Monday the 1st day of October 1984. 
at or before ten o'clock A.M. before 
the Honorable 112th District Court of 
Crockett County .*Texas. at the Court 
House of said County in Ozona, 
Texas

Said Plaintiffs Petition was filed 
in said court, on the 1st day of 
January A.D. 1984. in this cause, 
numbered 4646 on the docket of said 
court, and styled. Halliburton Com­
pany Plaintiff, vs. Good Earth Ener­
gy. Inc., et al Defendant.

The names of the parties to the 
cause are as follows:

Halliburton Company are Plaint­
iffs and GiMxl Earth Energy, Inc.. 
Merit Gas Sc Oil. TBA Partnership 
composed of Daniel B. Thomas. Ora 
Lee Boss. Gary Adolf. Indv. Sc 
Partners. Rye Supply Co., Inc.. 
Eicon Trucking Inc., Castleberry 
Drilling Service. Ira Smith. Garri­
son Contractors. Inc.. Western Com­
pany of North America. Bell Pet­
roleum Surveys. Inc.. AWS Servic-

QTATION BY PUBUCATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
To: Gary Adolph Defendant, Greet­
ing:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear by filing a written answer to 
the Plaintiffs Petition at or before 
ten o’clock A.M. of the first Monday 
after the expiration of forty-two days 
from the date of the issuance of this 
citation, same being Monday the 1st 
day of October 1984, at or before ten 
o’clock A.M. before the Honorable 
112th District Court of Crockett 
County, Texas, at the Court House of 
said County in Ozona, Texas.

Said Plaintiffs Petition was filed 
in said court, on the 1st day of 
January A.D. 1984, in this cause, 
numbered 4646 on the docket of said 
court, and styled. Halliburton Com­
pany Plaintiff, vs. Good Earth Ener­
gy, Inc., et al Defendant.

The names of the parties to the 
cause are as follows:

Halliburton Company are Plain­
tiffs and Good Earth Energy. Inc.. 
Merit Gas & Oil. TBA Partnership 
composed of Daniel B. Thomas. Ora 
Lee Boss. Gary Adolf. Indv, Sc 
Partners. Rye Supply Co.. Inc.. 
Eicon Trucking Inc., Castleberry 
Drilling Service. Ira Smith. Garri­
son Contractors. Inc.. Western Com­
pany of North America. Bell Pe­
troleum Surveys. Inc.. AWS Servic­
ing Co. Sc Shoreline Supply Com­
pany. are Defendants

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit is as follows, to wit: 

The Defendant Gary Adolph is a 
purported owner of an undivided 
interest in the working interest of the 
Scull Leases, and therefor, their 
interest in said leases is subject to 
foreclosure of PlaintifTs Lien Claims 
as is more fully shown by Plain­
tiff s Petition on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served within 
ninety days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served.

The officer executing this process 
shall promptly execute the same 
according to law, and make due 
return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at office 
in Ozona, Texas, this the 20 day of 
August A.D. 1984.
(Seal)
Attest: Debbi Puckett, Qerk 

District Court. Crockett County, 
Texas.
By Alice M. Fay Deputy

26-4tc

CITATION BY PUBUCATION

ing C o. Sc Shoreline Supply Com­
pany. are Defendants.

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit is as follows, to wit: 

The Defendant Ora Lee Boss is a 
purported owner of an undivided 
interest in the working interest of the 
Scull Leases, and therefor, their 
interest in said leases is subject to 
foreclosure of Plaintiffs Lien Claims 
as is more fully shown by Plain­
tiff’s Petition on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served within 
ninety days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served.

The officer executing this process 
shall promptly execute the same 
according to law, and make due 
return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at office 
in Ozona. Texas, this the 20 day of 
August A.D. 1984.
(Seal)

Attest: Debbi Puckett, Qerk 
District Court, Crockett 
County. Texas 
By Alice M. Fay Deputy.

« 26-4tc

E W A R D  $ 1 ,0 0 0  for informotion|
I leading to the arrest and prosecution of 

vandalism or removal o f flowers at 
Cedar Hill Cemetery.

Contact Sheriff Billy Mills

Animal warning

device used for

cars and trucks
An ultrasonic device is now on the 

market which warns animals of an 
approaching motor vehicle so that they 
do not run in front of it.

Intended primarily to prevent fi’e- 
quent accidents involving deer and 
vehicles, the devices also, warn other 
wildlife and domestic animals of an 
approaching vehicle, says Billy Reagor 
county agent with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service, Texas A&M 
University System.

In tests in Europe the device was 
reported 80 percent effective with 
deer, bears, elk, skunks, dogs and 
cats.

The Sav-A-Life animal warning 
device involves a pair of two-inch long, 
bullet shaped instruments mounted on 
the front bumper of a vehicle. There 
are no moving parts, but as the vehicle 
attains a speed of 30 mph, air rushing 
through the cylinder emits high fre­
quency sound which projects up to a 
quarter of a mile. The sounds stop 
most animals in their tracks but cannot 
be heard by humans, according to 
information provided by the product’s 
manufacturer.

Some trucking companies and fleet 
vehicle operators are installing the 
devices on all vehicles to prevent 
accidents and save the lives of 
animals.

Information on the new ultrasonic 
warning device is available fi'om 
Save-A-Life, Inc., Box 1226, New 
York, NY 10025.

Baseball 
team honored

THE OZONA ROYALS baseball team 
shown above, was recently honored 
by the Knights of Colnmbns Conndl 
#8572, with a banquet. Knight of the

month awards were presented for 
August and September. Recipients of 
awards were Elliott Barrera for Ang- 
nst and Raymond Borrego for Sept­
ember.

Protecting the elderly from drugs,
and the effects of overdose

S. S. cards can

only be issued

to U. S. citizens

THE STATE OF TEXAS
To: Castleberry Drilling Service De­
fendant. Greeting:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear by filing a written answer to 
the Plaintiff's Petition at or before 
ten o'clock A.M. of the first Mon­
day after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same being 
Monday the 1st day of October 1984. 
at or before ten o’clock A.M. before 
the Honorable 112th District Court of 
Crockett County. Texas, at the Court 
House of said County in Ozona. 
Texas.

Said Plaintiff s Petition was filed 
in said court, on the 1st day of 
January A.D. 1984. in this cause, 
numbered 4646 on the docket of said 
court, and styled. Halliburton Com­
pany Plaintiff, vs. Good Earth Ener­
gy. Inc., et al Defendant.

The named of the parties to the 
cause are as follows:

Halliburton Company are Plain­
tiffs and Good Earth Energy. Inc.. 
Merit Gas & Oil, TBA Partner­
ship composed of Daniel B. Thomas. 
Ora Lee Boss. Gary Adolf. Inv. Sc 
Partners. Rye Supply Co.. Inc.. 
Eicon Trucking Inc.. Castleberry 
Drilling Service, Ira Smith, Garrison 
Contractors. Inc . Western Company 
of North America, Bell Petroleum 
Surveys. Inc.. AWS Servicing Co. Sc 
Shoreline Supply Company are De­
fendants.

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit is as follows, to wit;

The Defendant Castleberry Drill­
ing Service is a purported owner of 
an undivided interest in the working 
interest of the Scull Leases, and 
therefor, their interest in said leases 
is subject to foreclosure of Plain­
tiffs Lien Claims as is more fully 
shown by Plaintiffs Petition on file 
in this suit.

If this citation is not served within 
ninety days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served.

The officer executing this process 
shall promptly execute the same 
according to law, and make due 
return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at office 
in Ozona, Texas, this the 20 day of 
August A.D. 1984.
(Seal)

Attest:
Debbi Puckett Qerk,
District Court. Crockett County,
Texas.
By Alice M. Fay Deputy

26-4tc

Social Security numbers for work 
purposes can only be issued to U.S. 
citizens, permanent resident immi­
grants, and temporary aliens who 
have been granted permission to work 
by the Immigration and Naturalization 
Service, Franklin H. Upp, Social 
Security manager in San Angelo, said 
recently.

Even so, Upp said, legal aliens who 
do not have permission to work may 
need a Social Security number for 
purposes other than work, such as 
banking, school, or driver’s license.

In such cases, a Social Security 
number will be issued, but the card 
will be marked to show that it is not 
valid for employment. A prospective 
employer would know at once that the 
holder of such a card is not legally 
permitted to work.

Social Security numbers cannot be 
issued to illegal aliens for any pur­
pose.

A person applying for a Social 
Security number must present evi­
dence of age, identity, citizenship or 
alien status. In addition, a person 18 
or older must apply in person.

An applicant for a Social Securi­
ty number who provides false docu­
ments or false information of age, 
identity, citizenship or alien status 
may be subject to a fine of $5,000 or 5 
years in jail or both.

More information about Social Se­
curity numbers can be obtained at the 
San Angelo Social Security office 
located at 2214 Sherwood Way.

Older people take a lot of pills. 
Although only 11 percent of the U.S. 
population is over 65, this group takes 
about 25 percent of all prescrip­
tion drugs-and not always to good 
effect.

Used carefully and appropriately, 
drugs can improve the quality of life 
for the elderly, but they can also cause 
problems, says Dr. Judith Warren, a 
gerontologist with the Texas A&M 
University Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice home economics program.

Some elderly people take incorrect 
medications, too much medication or a 
combination of drugs that are not 
compatible, she says. Then, if they 
suffer fatigue, confusion or depres­
sion, the symptoms may be written off 
as evidence of simply growing old. 
The problem may be compounded if 
the elderly patient’s symptoms are 
inappropriately treated with a tranqui­
lizer or antidepresant.

Drugs are a special problem for the 
elderly because certain body organs 
become more responsive to drugs as 
we age, notes Warren. In addition, as 
older people take more and more
drugs, the likelihood of interactions 
and side effects increases along with 
the chances of making a mistake in 
dosage.

Warren suggests that family mem­
bers, concerned friends or health­
care professionals consider the follow­
ing steps to help protect the elderly 
from adverse drug effects:

Encourage a regular review of all 
medications taken by the patient. Put 
everything fi’om the medicine cabinet 
into a bag and take it into the doctor’s

office. Keeping drugs that were pre­
scribed years ago can be a danger­
ous practice. Over-the-counter sleep­
ing aids, diet pills or laxatives can also 
interact badly with the prescribed 
drugs, and prescriptions from more 
than one physician may have an 
adverse effect on each other.

Ask about uppers and downers. Ask 
the doctor whether mind-altering 
drugs are really needed and whet­
her they should be taken regularly or 
just occasionally for a particular 
episode of insomnia or anxiety, for 
example. These drugs are too often 
prescribed for the elderly in an 
attempt to relieve the effects of life 
problems such as isolation and lonli- 
ness. Getting out of the house, making 
social contacts and other activities 
should be considered in place of 
drugs.

Manage pill-taking. Enter the list of 
drugs on a calendar and check off each 
dose as it is taken. Or use a set of 
small envelopes marked with the time 
of day. Sometimes a visiting nurse or 
family member will need to allocate 
pills dose-by-dose to the envelopes to 
make sure that the patient is taking 
the appropriate amount. However, the

presence of young children in the 
household may require a different pill 
management method for safety’s 
sake.

Keep a drug schedule as straight­
forward as possible. Work with the 
physician to eliminate drugs that are 
not strictly necessary and choose those 
that can be taken once or twice a day 
instead of more frequently. Select­
ing pills that look different from one 
another-as long as this does not affect 
the quality of treatment--can help the 
patient keep track.

Be alert for any new symptoms, 
especially nonspecific complaints such 
as fatigue, weight loss or confusion, 
that could be the adverse effect of a 
drug rather than a disease or simple 
aging.

OZONAN’S KIN DIES
Mrs. Qay (Martha) Taylor, 69, died 

September 7, in Rankin District Hospi­
tal after a lengthy illness. Services 
were held at the First Baptist Church, 
Sunday, with burial in the Rankin 
Cemetery. Her nephews were pall­
bearers. Her husband, Clay Taylor, 
preceded her in death in September 
1982. She was the sister-in-law of Mrs. 
Ray Dunlap of Ozona.
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TONYA RUTHARDT

Has Made 
Bridal Selections 

at
BROWN FURNITURE 

COMPANY
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TONYA RUTHARDT 
made bridal selections 

at

THE COTTAGE COLLECTION

Notice o f
RfWARD

I am offering

*500 Reward
for apprehension and conviction of 
guilty parties to every theft of 
livestock in Crockett County-except I 
♦Ita* no officer of Crockett County » 
may clidm the reward.

Sheriff, Crockett Co.

B illy  M ills

‘State of the Art** Gasoline Service

Datafl^ef
of the Southwest

Simply
Insert your m agnetically cod ed  
“Datafleet” card, set your odometer 
reading for MPG computation, select a 
pump, and enjoy “State of the Art” self- 
s p ru irc  fu e lin o .. . .  a  n e w  c o n c e j^ f In  

a u t o m a t e d  g a s q j l ln e  
s e rv ic e  s a v in g  y o u ^ m e  
a n d  m o n e y  . . . t i m  o r  
n ig h t  '

Advantages of 
**Datafleet of the 
Southwest.ff .

No cash, no checks, no paperwork 

24 hour availability, 7 days a week 

Convenient locations 

Competitive prices

Dependable service with no atten­
dants to wait on or delay you

An Itemized Statement sent to you 
every month that includes your 
credit card number, time and date of 
purchase, odometer reading and 
number of gallons purchased.

Pick up your opplication today!
at

SHELTON OIL & GAS COMPANY
and

ini

Hwy. 290 Vi.
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Extension Office News Parents and
■ youths, formBy* Rachel Hall

Upcoming Activities
September 13-Foods and Nutrition 

Leaders Meeting, 5:15 p.m., County 
Extension Office. We will be review­
ing new foods and nutrition guides, 
selecting food show committees, food 
show date, and leader training meetr-

meet-
ings.

September 13-Program Building 
Committee Meeting, 7:30 p.m.. Coun­
ty Extension Office.

September 17-4-H and Youth Com­
mittee Meeting, 7:00 p.m., high 
school library. 4-H Parents-Leaders 
Association Meeting, 7:45 p.m., high 
school library.

September 18-State 4-H Fashion 
Show, 7:30 p.m.. City Auditorium, 
San Angelo.

September 19 and 20-State Texas 
Extension Homemakers Association 
Meeting, San Angelo.

**
Last week’s “ Women of the 80’s“ 

seminars hosted an array of excellent 
information in the areas of household 
management, meal planning, invest­
ment dressing, credit and investments 
and family communications. Over the 
next few weeks, I’ll be sharing 
information related to these topics in 
this column.

In Jan North’s presentation, Quick 
Easy Meals, she proposed many meal 
saving tips including: organizing your 
kitchen, shopping to save time. Mas­

ter Mixes, importance of lists, menu 
planning, and time-saving equipment.

Let’s look at supermarket shop­
ping. A few ideas listed below can 
save you money and get you through 
the market in the shortest time 
possible.

Check High and Low-Grocery stores 
often display expensive foods at eye 
level. Check highest and lowest 
shelves for best prices.

Hungry-Don’t shop for food when 
you’re hungry, because you’ll only 
buy more.

Buying Meat-Compare price on 
basis of cost per portion, rather than 
cost per pound.

Coupons-Use them to help save 
money on products you normally buy. 
You may find coupon items to be more 
expensive than one without a coupon.

Lists-Always use a list to shop with. 
It’ll organize your shopping. Deviate 
from your list only if you find items on 
special.

Store Ads-read and compare news­
paper prices. Even if you prefer 
shopping at one store, you may find a 
real bargain at another.

Pet Food-Buy pet food in large 
quantities, to save on expensive small 
quantities.

Resealable Bags-storage for 
chopped bell pepper, nuts, coconut, 
grated cheese, bread crumbs, meats, 
etc.

Texas crime rate drops, DPS
A 3.7 per cent drop in the Texas 

crime rate was recorded for the first 
half of this year compared to the same 
period in 1983, according to statistics 
compiled by the Department of Public 
Safety.

“ Combined reports from 776 agen­
cies indicated a rate of 2,879.8 major 
crimes per hundred thousand popula­
tion for the first six months of 1984,” 
said Colonel Jim Adams, DPS direc­
tor. “The rate for the same period in 
1983 was 2,989.7.”

Adams said the actual number of 
major crimes reported during the 
period also declined.

“ A total of 452,825 crimes were 
reported, amounting to a decrease of 
almost one per cent compared to the 
first half of 1983. This is a contin­
uation of the trend we saw in 1983, 
when the number of crimes declined 
for the first time since 1961.”

The DPS director said four of the 
seven major crime categories register­
ed decreases.

“ Murders were down 8,2 per cent,' 
robbery cases dropped almost 10 per 
cent, and aggravated assaults de­
clined by almost four per cent,” 
Adams said. “ Burglaries were down 
5.1 per cent.”

The number of rapes rose 11.6 per 
cent, theft cases were up 1.4 per cent, 
and motor vehicle thefts increased by 
2.7 per cent.

Arrests for the period totaled 
439,061, a decrease of 4.3 per cent 
compared to 1983. Drug arrests were 
up 16.6 per cent, totaling 27,888. 
There were 66,959 DWI arrests in the 
first half of this year, a decline of 
seven per cent.

“ Hopefully, the increased level of 
public awareness about the drunken 
driving problem and tougher laws

have reduced the number of DWI 
offenders on our roads,” Adams 
pointed out. “ But the number arrest­
ed indicates that we still have a 
serious problem and DWI enforce­
ment continues as a major priority of 
police agencies.”

Two Texas law enforcement offi­
cers were killed in the line of duty by 
criminal action, while one died as a 
result of a job-related accident. A total 
of 1,751 officers were assaulted while 
on duty.

Statistics showed from Jan.-June 
1983 there were 1,062 murders and 
Jan.-June 1984 there were 975, down 
8.2%.

Jan.-June 1983 there were 3,057 
rapes and 3,413 in the same period 
during 1984. This was a volume 
change of plus 11.6%

There were 14,821 robberies in 1983 
(Jan.-June) and 13,352 in the same 
months of 1984 which was down 9.9%.

Aggravated Assault-21,273 in Jan.- 
June 1983 and 20,441 (Jan.-June) 
1984, down 3.9%.

Burglary-129,854-Jan. thru June 
1983 and Jan.-June 1984 was 123,224 
which was down 5.1%.

Theft-247,085, Jan.-June 1983; 
250,672 for Jan.-June 1984-up 1.4%.

Motor Vehicle Theft-39,688 
Jan.-June 1983 with 40,748 fi’om Jan.- 
June 1984, plus 2.7%.

The total on murders, rapes, rob­
beries, aggravated assaults, burglary, 
theft, motor vehicle thefts were 
456,840 Jan.-June 1983 and 452,825 
from Jan.-June 1984 with a volume 
change of -0.9%.

DWI arrests for the first half of 1984 
totaled 66,959 compared to 71,972 in 
the first half of 1983.

V2 O F F  S P E C IA L
Congratulations Kathy &  Gary Lyles

176 lbs. Thinner!

Computers provide speedier 
checkouts and lower bills
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4-H partners
Parents, would you like to form a 

partnership with your youngsters? 
Thousands of parents are doing this 
every day in the 4-H program.

4-H is a program for youth be­
tween the ages of 8 and 19 and is 
administered by the Texas Agricultur­
al Extension Service of Texas A«ScM 
University System, points out Rachel 
Hall, county Extension 4-H program 
coordinator.

Through 4-H, parents get involved 
with their youngsters by helping them 
with one or more of over 100 pro­
jects. By getting involved with the 
projects, parents help their young­
sters learn basic skills and informa­
tion and help them to fulfill an 
obligation. The “ partners” then build 
on these successes in areas of project 
work, leadership, community service 
and many other character-building 
experiences, notes Rachel Hall.

By spending time with their sons 
and daughters in 4-H work, parents 
can overcome the problems commonly 
referred to as the “communication 
gap” or “generation gap.” 4-H 
projects serve as a beginning to start 
the parent-youth partnership, and the 
relationship can grow through mutual 
understanding and trust between par­
ent and child.

Parents and 4-H’ers learn to share 
the joys of winning and the disap­
pointment of losing and to jointly work 
out solutions to problems as they 
arise.

Contact the county Extension office 
(392-2721) to learn more about the 4-H 
program and how it can develop close 
family ties through working partner­
ships.

Entertainment 
to be taxed

The coming attraction at your local 
movie theatre may be higher prices.

Beginning October 2, admission to 
movie houses and to almost any 
entertainment event will be taxed 
under the new state sales tax of 4 1/8 
percent.

The Legislature passed the bill 
containing the new tax, and Govenor 
Mark White signed it into law in July.

The minimum tax starting October 2 
on a $5 movie admission will be 20 
cents. But theatre owners in some 
cities with a local sales tax and special 
taxes for mass transit will have to 
collect 30 cents per $5 movie.

The same tax applies to concerts, 
cover charges at nightclubs, drag- 
strips, health club memberships, 
horse shows, opera performances, 
rodeos, water slides, golf tourna­
ments, wrestling matches and profes­
sional sporting events.

The tax may or may not be spelled 
out to the ticket purchaser, but a 
businessman in the entertainment 
industry will be liable for collecting 
the tax. He has to get it from 
somewhere.

And that usually is the consumer’s 
pocket, which almost always foots tax 
bills.

Any questions regarding the new 
state sales tax on movies can be 
answered by calling State Comptroller 
Bob Bullock’s office toll free on 
1-800-252-555 or on the regular line.

ROBIN JONES MEMORIAL FUND

Mrs. Crystelle Childress for Peggy 
Holden.

L.D, and Georgia Kirby for Jay 
Miller.

Mrs. Cecil Hubbard for Peggy 
Holden, Jay Miller, Billie Jo Hayes.

Mrs. G.K. Mitchell for Robin Jones. 
Memorial Fund.

Memorial Chairman 
Mary Lee Jones

Computerized price scanning sy­
stems provide grocery shoppers with 
speedier checkouts, and can mean 
lower grocery bills-if you read the 
receipts,

“ Many people throw away the 
computer generated receipts listing 
each item, size and price without 
realizing that they provide an ideal 
way to keep track of food costs,” says 
Texas A&M University Agricultural 
Extension Service home economist 
Bonnie L. Piernot.

Consumers can use the receipt 
information to determine how much 
they spend in certain categories, such 
as food and non-food items; or meat, 
vetegables, packaged products, con­
venience foods and staples, she says.

Reviewing the scanner receipt helps 
identify categories where spending 
could be cut. You might find, for 
example, that you’re spending sub­
stantial amounts on non-food items 
that cost less at other types of stores, 
notes Piernot.

Scanner receipts also reveal impulse 
buying. Since impulse purchases 
make up about two-thirds of all 
supermarket decisions, reducing these 
costs can cut overall grocery expenses, 
says the home economist.

Regular review of scanner receipts 
permits consumers to track prices on 
products they frequently buv. Armed

with a good knowledge of prices, 
shoppers can better detect true 
specials in weekly advertising and 
unadvertised specials in stores, she 
explains.

Over time, receipt-reading con­
sumers can develop a shopping cal­
endar of items that are better buys at 
select times of the year. They can 
stock up when the price is right and 
save about 20 percent on food buying 
by eating foods in greatest supply, 
emphasizes the home economist.

Shopping at supermarkets with 
computerized cash registers and scan­
ning equipment is not without its 
disadvantages, observes Piernot. 
These supermarkets sometimes re­
move prices of items on the shelf as a 
means of reducing their costs.

Without item prices on the shelf, 
consumers have a difficult time com­
parison shopping among different 
brands. Lack of item prices also makes 
it more difficult to spot computer 
errors or unchanged special prices at 
the rherkout counter.

Because its eyeball is fixed, 
the whale must move its 
huge body to shift its line 
of sight.

Yours in 
Good Health

By-Stove Seaaom

utf wtf vu uu uu WM uu uu vu uv try
How to Save Your Teethy Your GmaSy 
Yoor Smiley and Your Money

High tech advances are not exclu­
sive to the space program or the 
computer industry. Major scientific 
developments intended to make life 
easier, simpler and generally better 
have been turning up in areas where 
you might least expect them.

Consider dentistry. Recent advan­
ces in dental science are allowing 
more Americans than ever before to 
keep their teeth for a lifetime, while 
rendering treatment virtually pain­
less.

Today’s dental office would seem a 
foreign land to your grandfather. 
Although restoring diseases teeth and 
gums remains basic to dental care, 
continuing research has expanded the 
scope of dental practice to include 
treatments and procedures unheard of 
just a few decades ago.

“ We are experiencing a change in 
the character of dental practice,” says 
Dr. Burton H. Press, president of the 
140,000 member American Dental 
Association. “ Dentists are fast becom­
ing the doctors of the head and neck, 
health professionals capable of treat­
ing a wide range of ailments and 
conditions far beyond those affecting 
our 32 teeth.”

W
9

ON NEW MODEL HOMES
READY BUILT HOMES ON OUR LOT TO BE 
SOLD AT REDUCED PRICES. THESE MUST BE 

LIQUIDATED FROM OUR INVENTORY.

SALE
PRICE

$35,900®®
THIS PRICE INCLUDES HOUSE ONLY

INCLUDES: 1056 SQUARE FEET OF LIVING AREA, CEDAR 
SIDING OVER BRICK WAINSCOT EXTERIOR, R 13 WALL IN­
SULATION. R 30 ATTICK INSULATION, GAS HEAT/CENTRAL 
AIR, GAS 50 GALLON WATER HEATER, ELECTRIC STOVE & 
VENT HOOD, 1 & 3/4 BATH, 5' PATIO DOOR OFF DINING AREA, 
ALL WINDOWS ARE INSULATED GLASS BRONZE COLOR, 
SALES PRICE INCLUDES 100 MILE FREE MOVING. FOUNDA­

TION, BRICK WORK, SEPTIC SYSTEM AND ALL HOOKUPS.

F t  }

R e a d i R  iLT H o m e s  
^BUILDERS SERVICE CO.

1700 NORTH PARK DRIVE SAN ANGELO, TX. 
OPEN MON-FRI 8 AM - 5 PM SAT. 8 AM • 12 PM 

(915) 663-6965

Ritz Theatre

V2 OFF*
*Begin your weight loss program this 
week and you'll save V2 off your program 
cost. Expires 9/14/84. Offer valid for new 
clients only. One special per person.

r - p  . _______  PLA ZA TO W ER I
l< ^ B A l» H 6 H > l> lC 4 lll LOOP 3 0 6  

w i g h t  lo ss  c e n te r s  | S U IT E  3 0 99 4 2 - 7 6 9 7

Present this coupon 
and receive
00 OFF

regular admission price, 
at The Ritz Theatre.

SHOWTIMES: 
Fri-Thurs..

7:30 p.m.-9:45 p.m. 
Sat.-Sun. Matinees 
1:30 p.m.-3:45 p.m. 
(1 :30 showing all 
seats $2.00.)

Shy, quiet
T e ^  Pierce wanted 
a  little adventure.

And one day it 
walked into his life 
in a  red silk dress.

An OSUOSi PiCTUfiES Relexe
© 19M Orion PicturM Corporation. Ait Riphtt Raaarvod. PO-13
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FOOTBALL
H O M K O M IH G

OZONA LIONS
-VS-

[DEN BULLDOGS
HERE 8:00 p.m.

Weekly Pick 'em Sheet 
Pick the Winner

$20.00 Jackpot

□  EDEN VS.
□  ANGELO STATE VS.
□  AUBURN VS.
□  OKLAHOMA VS.
□  N.Y. GIANTS VS.
□  SEATTLE VS.
□  HOUSTON VS.
□  CINCINNATTI VS.
□  L.A. RAIDERS VS.
□  DENVER VS.
□  NEW ORLEANS VS.
□  HOUSTON VS.

OZONA □
CAMERON U. □  
TEXAS □
PITTSBURG □  
WASHINGTON □  
NEW ENGLAND □  
SAN DIEGO □
N.Y. JETS □
KANSAS CITY □  
CLEVELAND □  
SAN FRANCISCO □  
SAN DIEGO □

TIE BREAKER-PICK A SCORE

-PHILADELPHIA VS. DALLAS-

ScMd Footibofi Conteot Tot 
OZONA STOCKMAN 

BOX 370
OZONA TEXAS 70943

DewiBfeM to r coBteot fa Friday 
NAME---------------------------------
ADDRESS- 
PHONE NO.-

Ozona Lions prepare for homecoming

Sponsored By These Ozone Businesses:

Moness Texaco Stations 
Sonny's Drive In Gro.
First Savings & Loan
Ozone Inn o f the West 
[ I  Chato's Restaurant 
Clayton's YiUago Drug 
Grelo Bar Truck Corral
Thornton's Supermarket 
Watson's D ep t Store
Thorp's Laundry 
Crockett Co. Water District 
ilixaboth Upham Ins. Agency 
Southwest Texas Electric Coop, 
United Department Store

NO. NAME

OZONA LIONS ROSTER
WT. POS CLASS

10
11
12
15
20
22
23
24
30
31 
33 
40 
43 
45 
47 
50 
52 
55 
60 
61 
62
63
64 
70 
75 
78 
80 
81 
89

HARVEY FIERRO 
STEVE SANCHEZ 
AL RAMIREZ 
DAVID DELGADO 
DANNY MORAN 
JAMES SANCHEZ 
MATT GUTIERREZ 
J.B. GREEN 
DAVID ADAMS 
BETODIAZ 
ARTURO GONZALES 
CHUY HERNANDEZ 
VALDO GALINDO 
MARK MARSHALL 
DEROLD VARGAS 
BIAS VARGAS 
RAUL ARREDONDO 
RONNIE SMITH 
ABEL LARA 
JOHN CLARK 
GEORGE GUERRA 
MARIO ARREDONDO 
MARTY MORAN 
DONALD GUTIERREZ 
BROCK JONES 
EDWARD BORREGO 
DIRON HOLT 
JAIME CASTELLANOS 
UONEL MUNOZ

 ̂ ■I'l

Ozona T-V System 
Ozena Steak House 
Charlie's Place 
Montgomery Ward 
Westerman Drug
Happy Hollow 
Brown Furniture
B8t C Automotive 

Pope's Restaurant
Elma's Roadside Gro. 
Nicks Chevron 
Baggett Agency 
V.F.W. Post 6109 
Ozone National Bank 
South Texas Lumber Co,

Fesco 
Dairy King
O.J.B. Inc.
Wool Growers 
Moore Oil Co.
Horses Inn 
Ozona Butane 
Magicland 
Fierro Shell 
1-10 Exxon
Jim's Foodway 
Maxine's Flowers
The Flower Basket 
J.W. Motor Parts 
Dinas Poco Taco

8^* • Am !&
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VA reports 
POW claims 
on increase

A new Veterans Administration 
study shows that more than one-third 
of the nation’s living former prison­
ers of war are now receiving VA 
disability compensation payments. 
The VA says claims have increased by 
more than 30 percent since the agency 
began intensive POW outreach in 
October 1981.

The study, presented to a recent 
meeting of the VA’s Advisory Com­
mittee on Former Prisoners of War, 
summarizes the results of physical 
examinations conducted among some 
12,000 POWs who sought disability 
ratings or increases since enactment 
of special POW legislation in 1981. 
The vast majority of the claims-- 
nearly 8,000--were filed by World War 
II veterans with European Theater 
service.

The Committee, formed in 1982, 
provides the VA Administrator with 
recommendations concerning the de­
livery of health care and other bene­
fits to the nation’s 88,000 Iving POWs. 
The 12-member committee is chaired 
by retired Air Force Lt. Gen. John P. 
Flynn, a prisoner of North Vietnam for 
SVa years. Membership includes phy­
sicians and other individuals who have 
personal knowledge of the POW 
experience.

Outreach activities by VA have been 
directed toward informing POWs of 
priority access to medical care and the 
claims review process. Among sever­
al steps taken to make information 
more readily available was the instal­
lation of a toll-free POW Hotline 
(800-821-8139). VA is also developing 
a computer system for analyzing POW 
claims and health data.

While the VA study reflected in­
creased claims activity, it also showed 
that 63 percent of the POWs already 
assigned disability ratings did not 
request reviews. The VA continues to 
urge all POWs to participate in a 
special protocol examination designed 
to gather indepth information about 
these veterans and their current 
health.

Former POWs can schedule exam­
inations by contacting any VA medical 
center, clinic or regional office.

THE OZONA STOCKMAN WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 12, 1984 ^

The O.H.S. Junior and Senior Vica 
students elected officers on August 
31,1984. The officers from left to right 
are Danny Moran, Sgt. of Arms; A1 
Ramirez, Vice-President; Mario Arre­
dondo, Reporter; George Guerra, 
Parliamentarian; Ed Borrego, Secre­
tary of Treasurer, and Mike Lara, 
President.

It pays to know your food 
Additives from baby food up

Garden Club 
opens new 
club year

Thd^Ozbiiai Garden Club opened the 
current club year with a covered dish 
luncheon Monday at the Civic Center, 
hosted by Mrs. Beecher Montgomery 
and Mrs. Mike Clayton.

The meeting was called to order by 
Mrs. Bill Mason, president.

Mrs. Mike Ledoux introduced Mrs. 
Clifford P. Lunson, master flower 
show judge of Fort Stockton, who gave 
a design program featuring weathered 
wood.

Following the program, Mrs. Le­
doux reviewed the yearbook.

Monthly plant study on Iris was 
given by Mrs. Charles Williams.

Others attending were Mrs. Doug­
las Bean, Mrs. Joe Bean, Mrs. George 
Bean of San Angelo, Mrs. J. W. 
Howell, Mrs. Roy Jackson, Mrs. Brock 
Jones, Mrs. Steve Kenley, Mrs. Mike 
Miller, Mrs. Joey Pierce, Mrs. Bailey 
Post, Mrs. Tom Stokes, Mrs. O. D. 
West and Mrs. A. S. Lock.

GARDEN OF THE MONTH 
as selected by

OZONA GARDEN CLUB

The home of
MR. AND MRS. GARY PRIDEMORE 

Yucca Lane 
Country Club Estates

STOCKMAN CLASSIFIEDS GET 
RESULTS.

Long-term
credit

on
affordable

terms.

Federal
Land
Bank

i£ requuhohim
LE N D E R

MICHAEL W. SMITH 
President 

P.O.Box 397 
Sonora, Texas 76950

Food additives are found in groc­
ery products ranging from baby 
foods to coffee creamer. In fact, 
Americans swallow about five to ten 
pounds of emulsifiers, preservatives, 
flavorings, colorings, acids and vita­
mins in their food each year.

Yet few consumers can distin­
guish between products that use 
additives for a useful purpose, 
versus those that use additives to 
make a less-nutritious product more 
attractive, says Marilyn Haggard, a 
Texas A&M University Agricultural 
Extension Service nutritionist.

On the positive side, she says, 
preservatives help prevent spoilage, 
while emulsifiers keep water and oil 
mixed together. Vitamins and min­
erals add nutritional value.

According to the nutritionist, some 
of the most common useful addi­
tives include:

Calcium propionate--inhibits mold 
growth in bread.

Polysorbate 60-an emulsifier.
Beta carotene-an artificial coloring 

that the body converts to vitamin A.
Citric acid-an acid that occurs 

naturally in citrus fruit.
Thiamin mononitrate-a nutrient 

(vitamin B-1).
Carboxymethyl cellulose-a thick­

ening agent.
Sorbic acid-a preservative.
Casein-a protein that is obtained 

from milk.
Vanillin-the main flavor compo­

nent of vanilla.
However, shoppers should be con­

cerned when additives are used as a 
replacement for nutritional foods, 
says Haggard. For example, thicken­
ing agents are sometimes used to 
make a food look rich and thick, even 
if it contains smaller amounts of 
ingredients than a competing brand.

Artificial colorings and flavor­
ings are sometimes substituted for 
fruit, chocolate or other real foods, 
she explains. Caramel coloring can 
make white bread look like whole 
wheat bread.

Flavor enhancers such as MSG, 
may suggest to the eater that a food 
contains more meat than it really 
does. And vitamins added to sugary, 
non-nutritious foods permit extrava­
gant nutritional claims, notes Hag­
gard.

All food additives are tested by 
private companies. The Food and 
Drug Administration (FDA) then 
evaluates the tests and decides 
whether the chemical may be used in 
food, says the nutritionist.

Should you fix it or buy a 
brand new appliance ?

When the toaster gives out or the 
television set goes, every Texan 
confronts the old dilemma: Should I fix 
it or buy a new one?

The dilemma gets harder after 
October 2, when new tax laws on 
repairs go into effect.

The cost of repairing personal 
property-including home repairs-will 
be taxed under a new law passed by 
the Legislature and signed by Govern­
or Mark White.

The tax rate is 4 1/8 percent. A local 
sales tax of one percent or a tax 
authorized by the Legislature for mass 
transit in some of Texas’ large cities 
may boost the total tax to as much as 6 
1/8 percent.

This is the first time such a tax

DO YOU PREFER PRIVACY AND 
INDIVIDUAL COUNSELING WHEN 

YOU ARE LOSING UNWANTED POUNDS?
At Pat W alker’s yoi^ passive exercisev figure analysis 
and counseling is ail conducted irt strictest privacy. The 
exclusive Pat W alker’s program is unique and it works. 
You lose where you need lo  lose safely and surelh(*

110S:>AtEA 8t00«.m.
PhQee ' to
392’3707 SiOOp.m.

LETUSHEUPYOU

NO^HOTS  
^ a P IL ’L S  
N O jJ G f D iC r  
N O \ ) N f t E ) S ^ G i S E  

DOrPROMlSI 
RESULTS.

ONI W llK  m t l  
New Patrons Only

Michelle 
Mayde Jo
Pearletta

figyre Perfectiqp So|on|ln1»rrKjrionoi
OFFER EXPIRES 

iSept. 30, 1984

Ferrell to host special series 
on sex abuse of children, 13

This group of officers will be 
attending several meetings during the 
school year. Thier first meeting will be 
a student leadership meeting which 
will he held in San Angelo on October 
13, 1984. Vica is a student leadership 
club in cooperation with the Ozona 
High School Auto Mechanic Oass.

Nearly one out of three girls and one 
out of 10 boys will be the victims of 
sexual abuse by the time they reach 
their 18th birthday. ‘Preventing Child 
Sexual Abuse’, a pioneering television 
effort premiering on KERA/Channel 
13 Monday, September 17, looks at 
the realities of this tragic situation and 
provides simple, workable techniques 
that can significantly reduce the 
chances of child molestation.

The landmark series, hosted by 
actor Mike Farrell of MASH, consists 
of five separate programs, each of 
which is designed for a specific 
audience. The programs will be broad­
cast on Channel 13 over four days- 
Monday through Thursday, Septemb­
er 17-20-at 7 p.m.

The first episode, “ Program for 
Parents,’’ is for parents, teachers, 
pediatricians, school nurses and any­
one who has contact with children. It 
explains sexual abuse of children: who 
falls victim, who are the perpetrators 
and what the viewer can do to prevent

NICKNAME STORY FOLLOWUP
News stories sometime have a way 

of begetting other stories. The recent­
ly published feature in The Stockman 
about nicknames worn by Ozonans has 
brought the first explanation of a 
nickname. Alvin (Dogie) Harrell didn’t 
get his nickname because of his slim 
build. Rather it was because his 
mother and father, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Harrell, were ranch people 
and lived on their ranch.

Young Alvin, growing up and going 
to school in Ozona, stayed with various 
friends of the family during school 
days. He ate his meals with various 
households, slept in the homes of 
these and other friends—much like 
the dogie lamb mooches its living by 
running from one mother ewe to 
another and snatching a little food 
from whichever one it can.

it. This 90-minute program also pre­
views the forthcoming programs so 
that parents will be able to select the 
ones they feel are appropriate for 
viewing with their children. This 
program contains frank descriptions of 
sexual abuse and may be disturbing to 
younger viewers; it is recommended 
for viewing by adults and mature 
adolescents.

The second program, airing Tues­
day night at 7, is aimed at kinder­
garten through third-grade children. 
The 30-minute program was taped in a 
classroom in a Chicago elementary 
school. Rape counselor Mary Ellen 
Stone talks with the children about 
some of the problems kids have with 
touching-“good touches’’ (a hug) or 
“bad touches’’ (a pinch) and touches 
that may be uncomfortable or con­
fusing. Using storytelling techniques 
and “what if?’’ games. Stone helps 
the children develop coping strate­
gies for tough situations.

The episode for students in grades 
.four through seven airs Tuesday at 
7:30 p.m., immediately following the 
program for younger children. In this 
half-hour program, Mary Ellen Stone 
adapts the “good touch/bad touch’’ 
concept from the previous program to 
the needs of an older audience. Using 
the same framework for discussion, 
she presents material geared to the 
more developed understanding levels 
of children in these grades, exploring 
problems with babysitters, sex role 
stereotypes and child-parent commun­

ication.
Wednesday’s program, “No Easy. 

Answers,’’ is targeted toward junior 
and senior high school students. Using 
a presentation by the Minneapolis 
Illusion Theater Company to illustrate^ 
the uncomfortable and sometimes^ 
dangerous situations young people, 
encounter in adolescence, this hour-S 
long program examines the risks in|p 
the dating and growing-up processes' 
that can leave this age group espec-, 
ially vulnerable to sexual assault and^ 
abuse. f

The series concludes on Thursday 
with a program specifically for high 
school-age children. In discussions^ 
with older teens at a middle-Ameri-.y 
ca high school, this final prograni' 
continues the lessons of previous^ 
episodes and teaches students how to/ 
deal with dangerous situations and,,;, 
more importantly, how to avoid them 
in the first place.

To promote further public aware­
ness of sexual abuse and its pre­
vention, a special radio panel discus­
sion and phone-in program hosted by 
Bob Ray Sanders will air on Chan­
nel 13’s sister station, KERA/90FM, 
from 8 to 9 p.m. Thursday, Septem­
ber 20, immediately following the final 
episode of Preventing Child Sexual 
Abuse.

Preventing Child Sexual Abuse has 
been endorsed by the National PTA, 
the National Education Association 
and the American Academy of Pedia­
trics.

SUEZ SHRINE ORCUS
Make plans to go to Eldorado this 

Saturday, September 15th for the 
Shrine Circus. There will be two 
performances - 2:00 and 7:00 p.m. at 
the Rodeo Arena.

All children in the Ozona School 
System from Kindergarten thru the 
6th grade will be given free tickets at 
school. Doors open 1 hour before show 
time.

Listen to your local radio station 
KRCT and have a chance to win free 
adult tickets to the Circus.

TOOL VALUE
or THE MONTH

iiAumv/iKii:v/ii.iJi;
01 I h i : >i o \  I I I

Propane Torch
Ideal for soldering, loosen­
ing bolts, hobbies, more. 
Brass tip. M M 555-65  

Quantities Limited

Buy 2 
Get rebate 
coupon 
good 
for

3 M

While
Supplies

Last 344
16-Oz. ScotchgartT 
Fabric Protector
Repels stains, messy spills, 
water from upholstery, outer­
wear, etc. FC-4101-CR  

Quantities Limited

SOUTH TEXAS
1308 Av«. C

LUMBER CO.
392-2614

affects every household in Texas 
directly. Repairs of washing ma­
chines, dryers, lawn mowers, vacuum 
cleaners, microwave ovens (if they are 
freestanding) telephones and televi­
sion sets are all included.

Also included are the extended 
warranties consumers buy to protect 
these items.

Repairs to real estate are not taxed. 
Neither are repairs to items that are 
specifically exempt, such as eye 
glasses or hearing aids, motor vehicles 
and aircraft. Parts are taxed, but not 
the repair work itself.

If your watch breaks or if your 
camera’s shutter is on the blink, their 
repair is taxable at the place where 
you take them to get them fixed.

Certificates of Deposit?
Let US provide you 

with the missing 
information pieces!

The wonderful thing about our 
wide variety ot certiticate-ot- 
deposit plans is that there is one 
to tit your needs and budget!
We otter a choice ot long- and 
short-term maturities with high 
or low minimums so you can 
take advantage ot one or more 
high-yield, certiticate-ot-deposit 
investment programs. Your 
earning potential is up to you.
See one ot our banking profes­
sionals today tor more Informa­
tion. The sooner you do, the 
quicker we can provide you 
with the missing pieces to com­
plete your financial security 
picture.

CROCKETT COVNTir 
NATIONAL BANK

BANKING HOURS
Lobby*9{00 A.in.-4t00 p.m. 

Drive-In-8:00 a.m.*5t00 p.m. 
Monday-Frfday 

392.3745,392-5829

CROCKETT
COUNTY >

NATIONAL V  ¥
BANK / p r p m f D O

P.O. Box 1089 O zona, Texas 76943
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Local governments adopt new 
property tax rates in Texas

Local governments in Texas are in 
the middle of one of the most crucial 
ste|)s in the annual tax process-adop­
tion of property tax rates for the 1984 
tax'year.

The “ truth-in-taxation” laws con- 
taihed in the Texas Property Tax Code 
ensure that taxpayers will be informed 
of proposed tax increases through 
public notices and can become involv­
ed ̂ in the tax rate adoption process 
through public hearings.

Hiese laws also provide a limited 
fotin of initiative and referendum by 
which voters in some instances can 
reduce the amount of tax increase 
adopted by a taxing unit’s governing 
body.

Many tax assessors are now taking 
the first step in the truth-in-taxation 
process by calculating and publicizing 
this” effective tax rate.”

& he effective tax rate is a key 
e lu e n t  of truth taxation, a bench- 

by which any tax rate changes 
leasured. It is a tax rate that will 

;rate the previous year’s level of 
revenue for maintenance and 

opj^ation, based on the current year’s 
prjfcerty values for the property that 
wsStaxed in the previous year. It also 
in o d es  the tax rate necessary to pay 
th^taxing unit’s debt obligations for 
th^pcom ing fiscal year.

j^ e  tax assessor calculates the 
efrotive tax rate after the unit’s 
ap^aised property values are certified 

le appraisal review board and the 
appraiser. He must then publi- 

''the effective rate, along with the 
^ulations for the rate and an 

late of uncommitted tax revenues 
3ver from the previous year (called 
^encumbered fund balances” ).

is normally done by August 7 or 
Joon thereafter as possible, 

the members of a school board 
council, commissioners’ court or 

sr governing body decide to adopt 
a^px rate that exceeds this effective 
ra 0  by more than three percent, they 

St publicize their intent and hold 
pic hearings. If the tax rate they 
[lly adopt exceeds the effective rate 
imore than eight percent (with 
^ain exceptions for school districts),
[ voters can petition for an election 
)11 back the tax increase.

The effective tax rate, by using 
rent-year property values to gener- 
Iprior-year operating revenue, pre- 
fts tax bills from rising automatical- 
lecause of rising property values 

[reappraisals. Thus, according to 
Patterson, executive director of 

[State Property Tax Board, “ Rising 
les on existing properties cannot 

cijjSate new tax dollars; only action bv 
t f i  unit’s governing body can do 
tm t, and the taxpayers must be 
i®ified and given the chance to 
clem ent before that action is taken.” 
SThe effective tax rate also contains 

iustments for newly granted tax 
jmptions and productivity valua- 

^n. As a result, says Patterson, the 
Jective rate offsets the shift of tax 
Jrden to other classes of property 

<9jised by new exemptions or new 
jpductivity values.

[Properties on the tax roll for the first 
le (such as new buildings, new 

fmes or newly annexed territory) do 
jt figure at all in the effective tax rate 
Iculations. Thus, adding new prop­

erties or deleting part of the taxable 
value of property (by exemptions, 
productivity valuation, or deannexa­
tion causes a loss of tax revenue.

After the effective rate is publi­
cized, the next step in truth in taxation 
lies with the governing bodies of the 
taxing units as they decide what level 
of services to budget for and what tax 
rate will be needed to provide those 
services.

If the decision is to keep the tax rate 
within three percent of the effective 
tax rate, the governing body is not 
required to notify the public.

However, if the governing body 
intends to raise taxes by more than 
three percent above the effective rate, 
it must announce its intentions in a 
quarter-page newspaper ad and hold a 
public hearing to listen to the taxpay­
ers’ opinions on the proposed tax hike. 
A second quarter-page ad is required 
to announce the public meeting at 
which the final tax rate will be 
adopted.

If the tax rate is set more than eight 
percent higher than the effective tax 
rate, the voters can challenge the tax 
increase by petitioning for an election 
to limit the increase.

After a successful election, any 
taxing unit other than a school district 
would have its tax rate reduced 
immediately to eight percent above 
the effective tax rate. A school district 
would have its tax rate limited to the 
eight percent level in the following 
year.

As a result of new laws enacted in 
this summer’s special legislative ses­
sion, school districts will be able to 
increase taxes in certain instances by 
more than eight percent before facing 
the possibility of a rollback election. 
Between now and 1987, voters may 
not limit a school district’s tax 
increase that offsets the amount of lost 
state education aid or that increases 
the district’s enrichment equalization 
funds.

Patterson pointed out that tne 
property tax system in Texas gives all 
property owners several opportunities 
throughout the year to influence the 
amount they pay in property taxes.

“Open meetins and budget hear­
ings allow a taxpayer to express his 
opinion about his tax dollars are spent, 
appraisal review board hearings allow 
him to ensure that the value placed on 
his property for tax purposes is fair 
and in line with other values in the 
jurisdiction. And, truth in taxation and 
the rollback election process then 
gives him'the chance to have his say 
about tax-rate proposals that may 
increase his final bill,” said Patterson.

Taxpayers can find more detailed 
information on their roll in the Texas 
property tax system through a pam­
phlet entitled “Taxpayers’ Rights, 
Remedies, Responsibilities!” Copies 
are available at local tax offices or 
from the State Property Tax Board in 
Austin.

Benjamin Franklin in­
vented the rocking chair.

Public Notice
lOCKETT COUNTY WATER 
)NTROL & IMPROVEMENT DIS-
ICT #1 is accepting bids for 

^mprehensive Automobile Liability, 
Lilti-Peril, and Standard Workmen’s 
jimpensation & Employers Liability 
surance.

^Bids to be submitted to Water 
flee, before October 1,1984. 29-2tc

NOTICE-P. C. Perner of Lubbock, is 
no longer associated with Perner 
Ranch Co., Ozona, and will not be 
responsible for any debts incurred 
other than those by P. C. Perner, 
Peggy Perner or Phillip Perner. 29-2tc

)TICE OF APPUCATION FOR 
LUID INJECTION WELL PERMIT
fsUN EXPLORATION &  PRODUC- 
lON CO., P.O. BOX 1861, MID- 
^ND, TX. 79702 has applied to the 
iilroad Commission of Texas for a 
brmit to inject fluid into a formation 
jiich is productive of oil or gas. 
;The applicant proposes to inject 
lid into the San Andres, Shannon 
state -B-, Well Number 21, 23, 29, 
7, 53. The proposed injection well is 
:ated 14 miles southeast from Iraan, 

lx. in the Shannon (San Andres) 
field, in Crockett County. Fluid will 
fe injected into strata in the subsur- 
sice depth interval from 1972 to 2208 
bet.

LEGAL AUTHORITY: Chapter 27 of 
le Texas Water Code, as amended, 

htle 3 of the Natural Resources Code, 
is amended, and the Statewide Rules 
&f the Oil and Gas Division of the 
Railroad Commission of Texas.

Requests for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
Adversely affected, or requests for 
further information concerning any 
aspect of the application should be 
Submitted in writing, within fifteen 
lays of publication, to the Under­
ground Injection Control Section, Oil 
ind Gas Division, Railroad Commis­
sion of Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 

fStation, Austin, Texas 78711 (Tele- 
ephone 512/445-1373).

29-ltc

THE STATE OF TEXAS
To: Edward Ray Foster, Respondent, 
Greeting:

YOU ARE HEREBY COMMAND­
ED to appear and answer before the 
Honorable District Court, 112th Judi­
cial District, Crockett County, Texas, 
at the Courthouse of said county in 
Ozona, Texas, at or before 10 o’clock 
a.m. of the Monday next after the 
expiration of 20 days from the date of 
service of this citation, then and there 
to answer the petition of Charolett L. 
Judd, Petitioner, filed in said Court on 
the 10th day of September, 1984,- 
against Edward Ray Foster, Respon­
dent, and said suit being number 4720 
on the docket of said Court, and 
entitled ‘In the interest of Darla Jean 
Foster, a child, ‘the nature of which 
suit is a request to change the,child’s' 
surname to the stepfather’s surname. 
Said child was born the 22 day of 
August 1969, in Big Lake, Tx.

The Court has authority in this suit 
to enter any judgment or decree in the 
child’s interest which will be binding 
upon you, as requested on the 
application filed herein.

Issued and given under my hand 
and Seal of said Court, at office in 
Ozona, Texas, this the 11th day of 
September, 1984.

Attest:
Debbi Puckett Clerk,
District Court, Crockett County, 

Texas.
By Alice M. Fay Deputy

29-ltc

Protect trees 
from damage 
in construction

The time to protect existing trees 
from construction damage is before 
construction begins.

“ Once a choice tree begins to 
suffer from construction damage, 
little can be done to remedy the 
situation,” says Everett Janne, land­
scape horticulturist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service.

Although most injuries are caused 
by mechanical damage from trucks 
and other vehicles, soil compac­
tion and changing the soil level can 
also cause irreparable damage.

To protect existing trees, con­
struct a barricade around them to 
insure that the soil is not disturbed 
as well as to prevent mechanical 
injury to the trunk and branches.

When the soil’s grade level is 
raised, it upsets the air and mois­
ture relationship in the soil, smoth­
ering rOot hairs and making roots 
unable to function.

“ As little as 3 inches of heavy soil 
placed over the root zone of an oak 
tree will kill it,” Janne says.

A simple tile or perforated plastic 
pipe system, properly installed to 
drain excess moisture away from the 
roots, will provide the essential air 
exchange necessary for normal root 
growth and development.

Terracing will usually provide 
satisfactory protection if the grade is 
to be lowered, notes Janne. If space 
is not available for a broad te r­
race. a retaining wall between the 
tree and the lower grade is effec­
tive. Deep holes must be placed in 
the base of the wall to allow trapped 
water to drain.

Trenching operations to install 
new utility services also can be 
deadly for trees, he points out. If a 
trench must pass near a tree, make 
any necessary cuts with a saw or 
pruning instrument to assure clean 
cuts. Backfill the trench as soon as 
possible to prevent excessive drying 
of exposed roots.

If many roots have been cut or 
removed, thin out the top of the tree 
to compensate for the lost roots, 
suggests the horticulturist. When 
trimming the tree, be sure to make 
all cuts back to a lateral b ranch- 
don't stub back major limbs.

PUBLIC NOTICE
B R IE F  E X P L A N A T O R Y  S T A T E M E N T S  

O F  P R O P O S E D

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
GENERAL ELECTION  
NOVEMBER 6, 1984

'  -Sit _When a honeybee finds nectar in flowers near its hive.
In 1893, New Zealand be- it returns to the hive and dances in circles to let its 
came the first nation in neighbors know where nectar can be found. When it Idaho is the only state in 
which women had the finds nectar in flowers that are far away, it dances in the the U.S. over which no for- 
right to vote. direction of the flowers. eign flag has ever flown.

REM EM BER W HEN
YO U  H A D •  •  •  •  •

a full time commissioner in precinct 1 whose 
office is open from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.

a college graduate and successful businessman 
to run the county business as a business

someone who got things done and not just 
made empty promises

a person who worked to build the Care Center 
for our senior citizens and who helped 
provide a youth center for our young people

a caring person who saw to it that our cemeteries 
were cared for in the proper manner

If you would like to have this type of service 
again reinstate JESS C.MARLEY to the office 
of Commissioner - Precinct 1

Pd. for by Jess C. Marley

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 29 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
th a t provides to state-chartered 
banks the same rights and privi­
leges th a t are or may be granted 
to national banks of the United 
S tates domiciled in this state! For 
example, if national banks become 
authorized to m aintain branch of­
fices, this amendment would extend 
the same privilege to s ta te  banks. 

The proposed constitutional 
amendment \vill appear on the 
ballot as follows: ‘"The constitu­
tional amendment to j)rovide 
sta te  banks the same rights and 
privileges as national banks.”

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 19 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
th a t restructures the Perm anent 
Univei'sity Fund to provide: (1) 
for the expansion of the institutions 
eligible to participate in the bond­
ing capacity of the fund to include 
the components of The University 
of Texas and Texas A&M Univer­
sity systems tha t have been added 
to those two systems of higher 
education since the Perm anent Uni­
versity  Fund was last restructured 
by constitutional amendment; (2) 
for the expansion of the purposes 
for which bond proceeds can be ex­
pended from new construction to 
include m ajor repair and rehabili­
tation projects and the acejuisition 
of m ajor capital equipment (e.g., 
computers and laboratory equip­
ment) and library books and m ate­
rials; (3) for an increase in the 
bonding capacity from 20''; (% for 
The University of Texas System 
and for the Texas A&M Univer­
sity System) to 30''t (20Vf for The 
U niversity of Texas System and 
10% for Texas A&M University 
System), of the ..value(;of the assets 
(exclusive of real estate) in the 
Perm anent. U niversity  Fund in or­
der to provide sufficient bond pro­
ceeds to care for the addition of 10 
new institutions to those authoi-ized 
to participate in • the Perm anent 
U niversity  Fund bonding program 
and to care for the expanded pur­
poses for which the bond proceeds 
can be spent; and (4) for the dedi­
cation of the dividends, in terest, and 
other income from the Perm anent 
U niversity Fund rem aining afte r 
paym ent of principal and interest 
due on bonds and notes issued, to the 
provision of support and m ainte­
nance (over and above normal leg­
islative appropriations) for Texas 
A&M U niversity in Brazos County, 
P ra irie  View A&M University, and 
The University of Texas a t Austin.

House Jo in t Resolution 19 also an­
nually appropi’iates $100 million in 
each fiscal year, beginning Septem­
ber 1, 1985 (from the f irs t money 
coming into the sta te  treasu ry  th a t is 
not otherwise appropriated by the 
constitution) for the use of those

education which are not included in 
The U niveisity of Texas or Texas 
A&M University Systems and, there­
fore, not eligible to participate in the 
Perm anent University Fund bond­
ing program . The am ount of this 
appropriation could be adjusted 
every five years by a % vote of 
the Legislature, but could not be 
adjusted in such a way as to affect 
outstanding bonding indebtedness. 
Each institution of higher educa­
tion th a t is eligible to participate 
(i.e., those institutions of higher 
education outside The University of 
Texas and Texas A&M University 
Systems) would be authorized to 
expend directly its share (such 
share to be determined pursuant to 
an equitable formula) of the $100 
million appropriation for the p u r­
poses of acquiring land, construct­
ing and e(juipping buildings oi’ oth­
er perm anent improvements, major 
repair and rehabilitation of other 
perm anent buildings or improve­
ments, and acquisition of major 
capital equipment (e.g., computei’S 
and laboratory equipment) and 
library books and m aterials. Addi­
tionally, each institution would be 
authorized to issue bonds backed by 
a pledge of Uf) to 50% of its share 
of the $100 million annual appro­
priation for the purpose of land 
acquisition, new construction, and 
m ajor rejiair and rehabilitation 
projects.

Except in the case of fire or 
natural d isaster and in othei- e x tra ­
ordinary cases, verifieil by a two- 
th irds Vote of each house of the 
legislature, all institutions of high­
er education would be precluded 
from receiving appropriations of 
general revenue funds for the pu r­
poses of land acquisition, new con­
struction, and m ajor repair and 
rehabilitation projects.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional amendment 
to create from general revenue a 
special higher education assis­
tance fund for construction and 
related activities, to restructure 
the Perm anent University Fund, 
and to increase the number of 
institutions eligible to benefit 
from the Perm anent University 
Fund.”

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 65 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which authorizes the legislature to 
provide for the paym ent of assis­
tance to the surviving dependent 
parents, bi'others, and sisters of of­
ficers, employees and agents of the 
sta te  or its political subdivisions, 
including members of organized 
volunteer fire  departm ents and 
members of organized police reserve 
or auxiliary units authorized to 
make arrests, who die in the course 
of perform ing hazardous official 
duties. Paym ents to surviving 
spouses and dependent children of 
agencies and institutions of higher

such officers, employees, and agents 
are already authorized by the Con­
stitution.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to pro­
vide for paym ent of assistance to 
the surviving dependent parents, 
brothers, and sisters of pertain 
public servants killed while on 
duty.’’

PROPOSITION NO. 4  
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Join t Resolution 20 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which abolishes the office of county 
trea su re r in Bexar and Collin coun­
ties if a m ajority  of the voters in 
each of those counties vote in favor 
of abolishing the office of county 
trea su rer in a local election to be 
held on the issue. All the powers, 
duties, and functions of the office 
of county trea su re r  in each of these 
counties would be transferred  to 
the county clerk.

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: ‘“rhe constitu­
tional amendment to abolish the 
office of county trea.«urer in 
Bexar and Collin counties.”

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Jo in t Resolution 22 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which provides a new method of 
filling a vacancy in the office of 
L ieutenant Governor. The am end­
ment require.-; the President pro 
tempore of the Senate to call to­
gether the committee of the whole 
Senate within 30 days a fte r  a 
vacancy occurs in the office of Lieu­
tenant Governor. The committee 
would be required to elect one of 
its members to perfonn the duties 
of the L ieutenant Governor until 
the next general election. This in­
dividual would continue his duties as 
Senator at the same time th a t he 
perform s the Lieutenant Governor’s 
duties. If the Senator who is elected 
ceases to be a Senator before the 
next general election, another Sena­
to r must be elected acconling to the 
above procedure to perform the Lieu­
tenan t Governor’s duties. The Presi­
dent jiro tempore would be re­
quired to perform the Lieutenant 
Governor’s duties pending the elec­
tion of one of its membeis by the 
committee of the whole Senate.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the sta te  senate to 
fill a vacancy in the office of 
lieutenant governor.”

PROPOSITION NO. 6 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 73 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
th a t perm its the use of public funds 
and credit for payment of prem i­
ums on non-assessable life, health, 
or accident insurance policies and 
annuity  contracts issued by a mu­
tual insurance company authorized 
to do business in th is state. The con­
stitutional prohibition against a 
g ran t of public money to an individ­
ual, association, or corporation or 
against becoming a stockholder in a 
corporation, association, or com­
pany has limited life and health 
group policies of political subdivi­
sions to non-mutual insurance com­
panies. The amendment would per­
m it m utual insurance companies to 
bid for those policies.

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: The constitu­
tional amendment to perm it use 
of public funds and credit for 
paym ent of premiums on certain  
insurance contracts of m utual 
insurance companies authorized 
to do business in Texas.”

PROPOSITION NO. 7 vt'k» 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 4 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
to change the membership of the 
S tate Commission on Judicial Con­
duct to include one Judge of a Mu­
nicipal Court and one Judge of a 
County Court a t  Law, who shall be 
selected a t large and appointed by 
the Supreme Court with the advice 
and consent of the Senate.

The amendment also provides 
additional grounds for removal from 
office of judges or justices of Texas 
courts, and provides additional dis­
ciplinary actions th a t could be taken 
in lieu of removal or censure. The 
amendment would extend the Com­
mission’s disciplinary au thority  to 
m asters, rnagi.strates, and retired 
or form er judges who hear cases 
by designation. The amendment 
creates a tribunal to review recom­
mendations of the S tate  Ccmimission 
on Judicial Conduct for lemoval or 
retirem ent of a judge or ju.stice. The 
review tribunal would be composed 
of seven (7) Justices or Judges of 
the Courts of Appeals selected by lot 
by the Chief Justice of the Supreme 
Court. The amendment also provides 
for appeal of the review tribuna l’s 
decision to the Supreme Court of 
Texas and g ran ts  an accused judge 
the right to di^^covery of evidence. 

The proposition will appear on 
the ballot as follows: The con­
stitutional amendment relating  to 
the membership of the S tate 
Commi.ssion on Judicial Conduct 
and the au thority  and procedui-e 
to discipline active judges, cer­
ta in  retired and form er judges, 
and certain  m asters and m agis­
tra tes  of the courts.”

PROPOSITION NO. 8 
ON THE BALLOT

House Jo in t Resolution 22 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which increases the per diem of 
members of the Legislature. The 
amount of per diem allowed during 
a calendar year would be equal to 
the maximum am ount set in federal 
income tax  sta tu tes as of Jan u ary  
1 of th a t same year as a deduction 
for ordinary and necessary business 
expen.ses incurred by a sta te  legisla­
tor. C urrent per diem is $30; the 
maximum deduction is now $75.

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ 'The constitu­
tional amendment to provide a 
per diem for members of the leg­
islature equal to the maximum 
daily am ount allowed by federal 
law as a deduction for ordinary 
and necessary business expenses 
incurred by a sta te  legislator.”

E stos son los inform es explana- 
torios sobre las enmiendas propu- 
estas a la constitucion que apara- 
cerdn en la boleta el dia 6 de 
noviembre de 198^. -S i usted no ha 
recibido una copia de los informes 
en espanol, podrd obtener una gratis 
por llamar al 1/800/252/9602 o por 
escribir al Secretario de Estado, 
P.O. Box 12887, A ustin , Texas 
78711.
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EMS crew learns how to 
behave at scene of crime

The regular E.M.S. meeting was 
held Monday, Sept. 10, at 7:30 p.m. in 
CCCC dining room.

Those present included four special 
skills EMT’s Dub and T.K. O’Bryant, 
Brian Henry and Joe Moran. Other 
EMT’s present were Dugan O’Bryant, 
Billie Kiser, Ben Ross, David Cooke, 
Elaine Walston, Lee Carlisle and Tina 
Moran. Doug Meador, who recently 
moved to Ozona from Matador, to 
accept a position with the Crockett 
County water district was introduced 
and welcomed into the EMS. Doug is 
an EMT. Also present were Don L. 
Carlisle M.D. and Don Hopkins, 
hospital administrator.

How to handle a crime scene was 
discussed. Things EMS personnel 
should be aware of when summon­
ed. Things such as first priority, which 
in all cases would be the patients. 
Other things to be aware of would 
include weapons, clothing, and other 
articles that would be used as identify­
ing evidence. Those present were 
shown how to handle weapons and 
remove clothing from the injured 
patient.

Issuance of ambulance supplies was 
also discussed. Future billing and 
price changes became effective imme­
diately. Each individual item in the 
trauma kits will be priced to make it 
easier for personnel when a run is 
made.

Ambulance runs made during the 
month will also be critiqued.

At this time the service would like to 
ask the cooperation of everyone when 
they should have the need to call for 
an ambulance. When a person makes 
the call to the hospital they should try 
to stay on the line long enough so that

Catholics plan 
Fall Fiesta 
for Sunday

Our Lady of Perpetual Help Church 
will hold a Fall “Tardiada” Fiesta 
Sunday, September 16, from 2 p.m. to 
8 p.m. Various parish and non­
profit organizations are sponsoring 
food and game booths. Musical enter­
tainment will accompany the festivi­
ties. The proceeds of the “ Afternoon” 
fiesta will go for the needs of the 
respective organizations.

The previous night, Saturday, Sept. 
15, there will be a dance in the parish 
hall from 8 p.m. to 12 midnight. 
Tickets will be $8.00 and can be 
purchased^ at VAh»Ramirez’s Grocery 
and Elma’s Drive-In Grocery. They 
will be $10.00 at the door.

For both events everyone is invited 
to come and enjoy themselves.

the person receiving the call can get as 
much information as possible. In other 
words when the correct address, 
medical problem, location of patient, 
age, if possible is known our personnel 
prepare what will be needed when 
they arrive on the scene. Time is what 
counts when a person is in distress. 
The more time saved lessens the 
jeopardy to that person’s life.

EMS meetings will be held every 
second Monday of each month and all 
EMS personnel are urged to attend.

Ambulance 
runs for week

Ambulance runs made during the 
week were as follows:

September 1, 1984-12:45 a.m.- 
Ambulance went 17 miles north of 
Ozona on highway 137 to a motor 
vehicle accident. One male patient 
was transferred to C.C. Hospital with 
abrasions and lacerations to the back 
and head. One female was killed in 
this accident.

September 2, 1984-12:00 p.m.- 
C. C. Ambulance transferred one male 
patient suffering chest pains to Shan­
non West Texas Memorial Hospital.

September 3, 1984-1:35 p.m.-One 
female patient was transferred from 
C.C. Hospital to Shannon Hospital.

September 3, 1984-12:40 a.m.-C.C. 
Ambulance was dispatched to the 
scene of a motor vehicle accident at 
Howard Draw Rd. and I-IO. One 
female patient was transferred to C.C. 
Hospital suffering multi-trauma.

September 4, 1984-3:04 a.m.- 
Female victim of motor vehicle acci­
dent was transferred by C.C. ambu- 
liance to Shannon Hospital.

September 6, 1984-11:00 a.m.- 
One male cardiac patient was trans­
ferred by C.C. ambulance to St. 
John’s Hospital.

Crockett County 
Care Center News

BY ANN McCa r t n e y  
DIRECTOR OF ACTIVITIES & SOCIAL CARE

Telephone users to have 
change in directory assistance

September is here but we are still 
having some of those “ dog days of 
summers” midday heat. But there is 
some autumn in the air in the 
mornings and this we enjoy.

Six members of the United Metho­
dist Church brought our Sunday 
church services. On Thursday Charles 
Huffman brought seven members of 
the Faith Lutheran Church for Bible 
study. Maria Vitela brought three 
members of the Our Lady of Perpet­
ual Help Church for Spanish Hour of 
Praise.

Qara Byrd and Vivian Hughes came 
for a fun Sing-along on Tuesday 
afternoon. They came back on Thurs­
day and helped Lola Rios with the 
beauty shop. We are always glad to 
have these volunteers around!

Ruth Hester and Mattie Cooper 
were our ceramic volunteers on Wed­
nesday. Dorris Karr and Ann Shaw 
helped by cleaning some pieces for us.

Sunshine Hour was sponsored by 
our Ladies Hospital and Care Center 
Auxiliary. Members Jo Davidson and 
Dorothy Doll were on hand to serve.

Thursday afternoon Rosa Jurado 
brought some twelve young boys who 
demonstrated the new art of break­
dancing. This was something new for 
many of our residents and we enjoyed
their performance. They promised to 
come again later this month. Thanks, 
boys.

Friday afternoon our faithful volun­
teer Dorothy Doll assisted a group of 
our ladies on a field trip to the newly 
opened Yarn Bam.

Bingo winners this week included 
Paul Cavin, winner of the El Chato 
dinner for two, Ola Mills, first place 
winner of a gift certificate from 
Clayton Village Drug and Moriama 
Perez second place winner of Avon

Ozonan's 
mother dies

Funeral services for Frances Pearl 
Lindsey, 98, were held last week in 
Healdton. Mrs, Lindsey was the 
mother of W. B, Lindsey of Ozona.

She died September 1 in Healdton 
Memorial Hospital. Other survivors 
include two more sons, 16 grandchil­
dren, 31 great grandchildren and eight 
great-great grandchildren. Grandsons 
served as pall bearers.

Commissioners 
Court, cont'd

The court approved the tax rate and 
budget for 19^, as amended in the 
called meeting last month.

Before adjournment, they appoint­
ed an Austin law firm to collect 
delinquent taxes and hired J. C. 
Schroeder to replace Dudley McCary 
as building maintenance supervisor.

Several -  hours were spent after 
luncn in executive session concerning 
personnel problems.

E.F. Hutton Talks About 
Financial Planning and Tax 

Sheltered Investments
E.F. Hutton is holding a special seminar for those 

interested in learning why every investment has tax 
consequences and how you can develop a financial plan 
to minimize them. Emphasis will also be placed on 
reducing the tax burden on personal income.

TOPICS TO BE DISCUSSED

1. Tax Free Municipals 10Vi percent
2. Tax Deferred Annuities 12.3 percent
3. Real Estate Investments with 300 percent Write-Off
4. IRA’s and Rollovers
5. Utilities 15Vi percent
6. Government Gtd 12 plus percent

Speaker: Robert M. Ragsdale, Vice President 
Time: 7:00 p.m.
Place: Sutton County National Bank 
_ _ (Community Room)
Date: Thursday, September 20, 1984

Call for reservations at 1-800-334-5606.

EFHutton When E.F. Hutton talks, people listen.

We Have
The Affordable A lternative Home

O P P O R T U N I T Y

Ready-To-Live-ln On Your Land
In cludes: M oving , Foundation , Porches, Centra l Heat 
d R egrigera ted  A ir , W ater A Plum bing H ookups, 
Cathedra l C e ilings, Kenm ore A pp lian ces , F irep laces , 
M ason ite  E x te r io r A sh  Cab inets, In su la ted  W indow s.

FHA/VA, Conventional Financing 
Our Plan Or Yours I

AKGEIO
Dedi Starkey. Mon. ■ Fri. 8-5 REAM "BUILT

653-7128 Saturday 11-5 ro T 5 ^ J ^ 0 2 jT r th  D* on"

donated by Monnie Boyd. Volunteers 
included Alice Ross, Maude Pettit, 
Sammy Patino. Amaldia Lumbreras, 
Inez Gutierrez, Elodia Zapata, Mon­
nie Boyd, Vivian Hughes, Dorothy 
Doll, Mattie Cooper and Anna Bell 
Patrick. Nineteen residents played on 
Tuesday and Friday.

Dominoes were played this week by 
Ola Mills, Paul Cavin, Maude Pettit, 
and volunteer Tina Holmsley.

Thanks this week goes to Fernanda 
Arredondo for donating body lotion 
and baby powder, to Delbert Stewart 
and Gabriella Tutor for magazines, to 
Jim Marks for popcorn bowls, and to 
Robin’s Flower Basket for four mum 
pot plants.

General Telephone customers here 
should take note of a change in the 
number to dial for local directory 
assistance.

“As of Saturday, August 25, the 
number to dial is 112-411,” said E.O. 
Cambem, GTE General Manager. 
General Telephone changed the infor­
mation numbers to correspond with its 
new digital switching system in down­
town San Angelo. The facility is linked 
to directory assistance operators, also 
based in San Angelo.

To obtain a number in another city 
located within your area code, there 
has been no change. Simply dial 
112-555-1212. If the city is located 
outside your area code, dial 112- 
the area code-555-1212.

“ Linking all our Concho Valley 
customers to the digital system is the^’̂  
initial step,” noted Cambem. “ W e \ l  
are switching all our toll (long dis4 
tance) traffic for nearby cities through., ,̂;, 
the San Angelo office, also recently” ,, 
converted to the new system.”

The digital system is computerT.,,,1̂  
based and has replaced the mechan-^^ 
ical telephone switching system withj^' 
state-of-the-art electronics. Similar-" 
conversions to digital systems arê .;;* 
planned for Concho Valley communi-,^^, 
ties in the months to come. " .^1

STOCKMAN
RESULTS.

CLASSIFIEDS GET

DON'T GET BLACKID OUT 
THIS FALL

WATCH ALL YOUR FAVORITE FOOTBALL TEAMS WEEK 
AFTER WEEK ON SATELLITE! COME BY AND SEE FOR 

YOURSELF------SATELLITE TV IS A STEP AHEAD!
N

S Y t T I M t  S T A I I T  A T  $ 3 1 9 8 *

THE
SATELLITE
SOURCE
9 1 6 - 9 4 M 4 0 7  
2 4 3 1  C o lta igB  HIIIb 
S a n  A n g a le ,  T T

of 
West 

Texas

silence
i s  n o t  g o l d e n . . .

Your Newspaper Ad

You’re right! The space is empty. There isn’t 
any ad. If you operate a business and don’t 
advertise, the silence is anything but 
golden* Advertising is really extending an 
invitation to your prospects and asking them 
to buy your products or use your services. If 
you aren’t advertising, you aren’t selling.

if you need more business, 
caii our business

The Ozona Stockman

<§:•
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For Sale

BACK TO SCHOOL desks and 
lamps. Large selection. Brown Fnni> 
Itore. 26-4tc

JUST ARRIVED -New shipment 
recliners. Shop while selection is 
good. Brown Fomitore. 26-4tc

GOOD NEWS FOR COLLECTORS of 
Friendly Village and Blue Danube. 
Brown Furniture has ample inven­
tory or will special order. 26-4tc

FOR SALE-2‘/a ton, Lennox refriger­
ated air & heating unit. Call 392- 
3679 for information. 22-tfc

FOR SALE-1975 Chrysler. New 
Yorker. Very clean, recently painted, 
luxury features. Call 392-3377. 24-tfc

FOR SALE- 1980 Buick Electra 2-Door 
Loaded-Clean. Call 392-3787.

FOR SALE-Wurlitzer Organ, model 
4070 with multi-matic percussion. 15 
years old, $750.00. Call 392-5853 or 
392-2220. 27-4tc

PORTABLE BUILDING FOR SALE-
Can be moved. Carpeted & air- 
jconditioned. Good hunting or fishing 
"cabin. Formerly The Yarn Barn. Ph. 
392-3394. 24-tfc

FOR SALE-12x64 trailer suitable for 
bunk house or hunting. $4500.00 for 
inore information. Call after 6 p.m. 

'392-3562. 10-tfc

FOR SALE- Quality Component Stereo 
System $700.00 Negotiable. Call 392- 
3593. 29-lTP

FOR SALE-1975 15-ft. aluminum boat, 
25  hp. Evinrude with Jet. Also trailer, 
«ftll 392-3161 or 392-3232. 29-tfc

.-...

3"®
Business Services

S r

.FOR YOUR Rinsenvac Cleaner come 
^  South Texas Lumber Co. 30-tfc

f̂
DECORATED CAKES and cookies 

:for special occasions. Call POLLY at 
392-3129. 39-tfc

£ KAY AND CO. UPHOLSTERY
jjP.O. Box 982, 392-3422 or 392-2184 
'Ozona, Texas 76943. Free Estimates 
Pick up and delivery, Wide selection 

• of fabrics. 19-tfc

f';

Stockm an  
c la ss if ie d s  

g e t  resu lts

A C T I V E ’
RETIREMENT

-4 C

It’s called the “Treasure 
Coast”—this stretch of the 
southeastern Florida penin­
sula from Ft. Pierce to Palm 
Beach. Today, more and more 
retirees seek the “treasure” of 
a comfortable lifestyle in the 
area’s pastoral setting.

Port St. Lucie, not quite 25 
years old, is one of the 
youngest and fastest growing 
areas in Florida. Located be­
tween Stuart and historic Ft. 
Pierce, this area’s newest 
community will add another 
5,000 residents with Savanna 
Club, a maintenance-free 
adult-golf complex offering 
relaxation and a laid-back 
lifestyle.

: S ''r
■ni-i

The natural beauty of Port 
St. Lucie makes it Flori­
da's ideal new retirement 
community.________________

Help Wanted

WANTED-Mature couple to give lov­
ing home to 16 yr. old boy with 
learning disabilities. Physically O.K. 
Loves animals. Will prove beneficial 
both from physical work and monetary 
gain for right couple. References 
required. Mother works. Call grand­
parents at 409-982-6972. Or send 
letter to 4201 Sequoia, Port Arthur, 
Texas 77642.

HELP WANTED-Apply in person 
Norma’s Kountry Kitchen. 25-tfc

HELP WANTED-Mobile operator, 
shift work. Call 392-3412.

28-tfc

NEEDED-Front help, cook and dish­
washer for Red Apple. Good benefits 
and added bonuses. Apply to J.B. 
Miller at Firestone Store. 27-tfc

HELP WANTED-Waitresses, apply 
in person at El Chato’s Restaurant.

46-tfc

Miscellaneous

OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sportswear, 
Ladies Apparel, Combination, Acces­
sories, Large Size store. National 
brands: Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbilt, Izod, Esprit, Brittania, 
Calvin Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Claiborne, Members Only, 
Organically Grown, Healthtex, 700 
others. $7,900 to $24,900, inventory, 
airfare, training, fixtures, grand open­
ing, etc. Can open 15 days. Mr. 
Loughlin (612)888-6555. 29-ltp

MUGGS STEPHENSON, independent 
color consultant for Beauty For All 
Seasons will be in Ozona, September 
18 thru Sept. 22 for color analysis, 
makeup and skin care. Call for 
appointment 392-2094. 29-2tc

:FOR SALE-flberglass Chrysler boat 
with 55 h.p. Chrysler motor and 
'trailer. Ph. 392-3161 or 392-3232.

29-tfc
^  -------------

JGOLF CART FOR SALE-853-2320 or 
” 392-2128. 29-tfc

PAPER WITH NAMES 
‘For That Distinctive Touch*

Personalized Stationery, Napkins- 
Bridge Cards-Paper by the Pound. 
Gussie Schneider, 392-2708, 604 
Coates St. Ozona, Texas. 22-tfc

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
MEETINGS-Sunday nights at Lilly 
Construction, 8:00 p.m. Ph. 392-2054

34-tfc

DO SOMETHING SPECIAL for your 
family THIS CHRISTMAS. Give them 
your LIFE STORY preserved on tapes 
for future generations. Call 392-2094.

29-2tc

“ Something Special’* Jewelry by 
appointment. Nesa Chandler, 
392-3583. Gold add-a-bead prices 
4mm-65c, 5mm-1.00, 6mm 1.50, 7 
mm-2.20,8mm-2.80. 25-tfc

0  JESSE 0  
Tire Repair 

Shop
c o r n e r  o f  A vc.

H & -5 th  St. 
F U L L T I M F  

R O A D  S E R V IC E
7 a.m. to 12 p.m. 392-347^

Nylon was first introduced 
to the public in 1938. Re­
search chemists of the 
DuPont Laboratories 
made this material by 
combining water, air and a 
by-product of coal.

Garage Sales

GARAGE SALE-Clothes, dishes, tools 
plants, fishing supplies. Kenmore 
washer, Saturday, Sept. 15. No sales 
before 8 a.m., 608 Ave. G. 29-ltp

3-FAMILY GARAGE SALE-1001 Hen­
derson Drive, Saturday, Sept. 15.

29-ltp

Garage Sales must be paid in 
advance. Due to the new six-column 
format the per line rate is 60c instead 
of 45c, however, the minimun rate is 
still $2.

For Rent

APARTMENTS FOR RENT-2 large 
bedrooms, large kitchen, large living 
room. Appliances furnished. Call 
392-3372. 23-tfc

FOR RENT-Trailer space. Call 392- 
2551 or 392-3208 after 5 p.m. 14-tfc

NICE CLEAN TRAILER SPACE for
rent. Call J.B. Miller Co. at 392- 
2641. 14-tfc

Business
Opportunities

INVITATION TO BID
Sealed bids are now being taken 

for a 500-gallon top ground propane 
tank by the Crockett County Water 
Control District #1. The tank may be 
seen at Ozona Butane Co. Send or 
bring bids by the Water District office. 
Bids will be accepted until Thursday, 
September 6, at 5:00 p.m.

^WN YOUR OWN Jean-Sportswear,
Ladies Apparel, Combination, Acces­
sories, Large Size store. National 
brands: Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbilt, Izod, Esprit, Brittania, 
Gavin Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Claiborne, Members Only, 
Organically Grown, Healthtex, 700 
others $7,900 to $24,900, inventory, 
airfare, training, fixtures, grand open­
ing, etc. Can open 15 days. Mr. 
Keenan (305)678-3639. 29-ltp

Mobile Homes

FOR SALE Mobile home 1983 Town 
& ( oiintrv Mansion"' 28x'*6 ft. 3 
bdrm 2 baths central air. .192-3"745

24-tfc

FOR SALE-14x70 ft. Majestic mobile 
home, 1981, 2 br., 2 bath, G.E. 
appliances, unfurnished. No equity, 
take up pavments. Call 392-2167 or 
392-5060. ' 22-tfc

MOBILE HOME-Nu Way 14 x71’. 
Excellent condition. Priced to sell. 
Call ONB 2-2676. 20-tfc

T IM E S  C H A N G E
T h a t m e a n s  y o u r n e e d s  fo r  
insurance change too. You m ight 
h a ve  to o  little  . . . m a y b e  even  
to o  m u ch .
So h o w  do  yo u  k n o w  if the  p ro ­
te c tio n  yo u  b o u g h t y e s te rd a y  is 
w h a t yo u  n e e d  fo r to d a y ?
It ’s easy . Ju s t ca ll a n d  te ll y o u r  
F a rm e rs  A g e n t yo u  w a n t a 
c o m p le te  rev iew  of a ll y o u r  
Tnsurance p o lic ie s .
T h e re ’s no cost and no  obligation

Elizabeth
Upham

P.O. Drawer U 
Ozona, Texas 76943 

Phone 392-2883

F A R M E R S  IN S U R A N C E  G R O U P  
of C o m p a n ie s

Real Estate

Texas Gulf Coast Rockport area, 
unique large oak tree covered lot with 
city water and electricity. Low down— 
low monthly-"Call 512-758-0299. 
Waterfi'ont available also. 29-4tc

REAL ESTATE
JOHNNY JONES, BROKER 

ELIZABETH UPHAM, AGENT
392-2883 392-2113 392-3601

Chandlerdale 
West Lots

Residential and Commercial
Portable  Buildings

YARD SALE-Four family sale. 
ClotheS"lots of kids, ladies, and 
men’s. Also dishes, etc. Thursday, 
Sept. 13, 9:00 a.m.-5 p.m. 101 Ramos 
St. 29-ltp

FOR SALE-2 bedroom, one bath, 
unfurnished house on 50 ft. by 200 
ft. Iot” fenced yard, good neighbor­
hood. 508 Ave. J. $27,500.00 Write 
to June L. Rumsey, 90 Red Bud Ln., 
Lumberton, Tx. 77656. 8-tfc

FOR SALE-Residential lots in Junip­
er Acres. Located on the old Mertzon 
highway adjacent to Sunset Acres, in 
Eldorado. For more information call 
J&R Properties (915)853-3345 or 
(512)896-7016. 24-tfc

Pepe's Restaurant
D e live rs  fo o d  o rders to  you r door

( N o  deliveries on Sundays)

Closed on Tuesdays Call 392-2906

3 FAMILY GARAGE SALE-Friday, 
Sept. 14, 9:00 a.m. till? 102 Ave. E

29-ltp
EXTRA NICE large mobile home. 3 
bdrm. office, utility room. Move to 
your lot. 392-2113, 392-2334, 392- 
2883. John R. Jones Real Estate

3-tfc

FOR SALE-2 year old 1 bdr. house. 
Can be converted into 2 bdr. Built on 
129’xl45’ lot. Call 2-5840.

20-tfc

Pete W. Jacoby 
Real EstatePh.

392-3059
H om cs-Lots-Com  m crc ia l

401 Hillcrcst 

Ranch P ro p er t ie s

HOMES FOR SALE
Tile Roof covers this neat 2 br. 
Has commercial possibilities on 
IH-10.

• •

NEAT 1 br. & 2 br. homes- 
Lots of storage-30’s.

« *

TOWN NOISE A PROBLEM?
Try this 3 br., 1 bath in Crock­
ett Hts.

« *
OTHER 3 bedroom homes & 
properties available.

y T S  & ACREAGE 
Choice Residential lots and small 
commercial acreage for sale.

FOR LEASE
Office Bldg, on main street. 
Fenced lot on IH 10 frontage 
road * «

BARNHART
Honse & 8 acrea-Owner wants 
|pffer & will finance!

♦♦
Thirteen fenced acres with bam.

If you have any Real Estate need 
[buying or selling, large or small,] 
please contact me. I may not have 
all the answers, but I will certainly 
try to help yop.

Thank you,
JOHNNY CHILDRESS 
Realtor-Broker 
1102 Ave. E 
392-3634 or 392-5051

N a t io n a l ly  A d v e rtis e d

M orning G lo ry Brown

Furniture Co.
Back Relief'Mattresses

fam ous fo r Q u a lity  s ince 1903

CHUDRESS REAL ESTATE
Johnny Childress - Broker

PHOHV ™
392-3634

If :.o answer call 392-5051

1m

H om es
Ranches
C o m m e rc ia l
Lo ts
Lake P ro p e r tie s  
A p p ra is a ls

Bank On It

Hours
A Day

OZONA NATIONAL BANK
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

Since 1905 Member FDIC
PHONE 392-2676,392-2694, 392-3787 

MAIN B A N K - 9 to 12 and 1 to 3 MOTOR B AN K - 8 to 5
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