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Dist. sets 
directors
election

The annual election of di­
rectors for the Crockett 
County Water District will be 
held Saturday, January 21, 
1984. Two places are up for 
election.

Anyone wishing to file for 
a spot on the ballot may do so 
at the Water Dist. office in 
person during the hours of 8 
a.m. until 5 p.m. prior to 
Dec. 22.

Directors whose terms ex­
pire are J.W. Johnigan and 
Duane Childress.

Living
Nativity

scene set
The Ozona United Metho­

dist Church invites the com­
munity to view the Living 
Nativity Scene, Wednesday, 
Dec. 21.

The choir and youth of the 
church will breathe life into 
the familiar people of this 
event, Mary, Joseph, the 
shepherds and the wise men 
as they surround the baby 
Jesus.

The animals will be pres­
ent around the manger, just 
as they were on that Holy 
Night.

Drive slowly past the 
chruch lawn between 7 and 
8:30 p.m. and view this 
scene.

Hoover is
contest
w inner
Winner of the weekly foot­

ball contest was H.O. Hoo­
ver, who missed three games 
in the weekend of upsets. 
Felipe Castro also only 
missed three, but Hoover 
picked Cincinnati to beat 
Detroit in the tie-breaker, 
while Castro picked Detroit.

There will only be one 
more contest, the one in this 
week’s edition. Entry blanks 
may be found on the sports 
page sponsored by local mer­
chants and the Stockman. 
Everybody is eligible to en­
ter. Entries must be in the 
mail or in the Stockman 
office by 5 p.m. Friday.

FFA Stock
Show
set for Sot.

The annual Ozona FFA 
Stock Show will be held 
Saturday, December 17, at 
the showbarns. The event is 
scheduled to begin at 9:00 
a.m.

Donuts, coffee and Cokes 
will be served in the morn­
ing hours with a barbecue at 
12:00 noon. Trophies and aw­
ards will be presented after 
the barbecue lunch.

Tickets for the barbecue 
are $3.50 per plate and can 
be bought in advance from 
any FFA member. Everyone 
is cordially invited to attend 
this show and support the 
local chapter.

7 sh o p p in g  d ays

C h ristm as

w on d e rland

ONLY PART OF THE SCENE at the 
Hilderbrand home on Angus, It was 
Impossible, with onr limited facilities, to 
get a picture of the entire Christmas 
scene. In this one Christmas elves dip

diocolate to the right of the ginger­
bread house, while two more get 
Christmas cookies from the red brick 
oven.

Hawks and Cranettes 
get top spots in tourney

The 53rd annual Ozona 
basketball tournament is his­
tory and the Wall Hawks 
came away with the champ­
ionship for the boys divi­
sion, while the Crane Gol­
den Cranettes won the girls 
division, in the champion­
ship games Saturday night.

The Fort Stockton boys 
and girls took the second 
place trophies, as the boys 
fought valiantly with Wall 
and their girls with Crane in 
the championship games.

The Menard boys got the 
third place trophy and the 
Ozona Lionettes third for 
girls.

Ozona Lions and Junction 
girls took the consolation tro­
phies in the two divisions.

In the first round Thurs­
day in the boys varsity 
division, Menard beat Eldor­
ado 50-41; Fort Stockton 
downed Junction 52-35; Ir- 
aan beat Ozona, 55-52; and 
Wall topped Llano 58-46.

In the varsity girls divi­
sion Thursday, Wall downed 
Menard 35-30; Crane beat 
Junction 44-37; and the Lion­
ettes beat the Lake View J.V. 
35-33.

In the semi-finals Friday, 
boys division, Eldorado beat 
Junction 40-32; Fort Stockton 
downed Menard 45-41; Ozo­
na Lions beat Llano 66-57, 
and Wall trounced Iraan 
65-38.

In the finals Saturday, the 
Ozona Lions beat Eldorado 
50-41, in the consolation. 
Menard took third place with 
a win over Iraan 69-48, and 
Wall downed Fort Stockton 
for the championship with a
53- 45 victory.

In the girls finals Junc­
tion beat Lake View J.V.
54- 38 for consolation. The 
Lionettes beat Wall 40-35 for 
third place, and Crane was 
victorious over Fort Stockton 
to the tune of 54-42 in the 
championship game.

The all-toumament teams 
were announced after the 
finals. Making the team for 
the boys were David Jones of 
Llano, Thomas Clay of Ir­
aan, Harvey Fierro and Steve 
Sanchez of Ozona, Alan Mor­
ales and Joe Hough of Me­
nard, Richard Morales and 
Bobby Templeton of Fort 
Stockton, Lance Powell and 
Mark Ray of Wall. Doyle 
Weishunn of Wall was cho­
sen most valuable player.

The girls all tournament

team was made up of Con­
nie Halfmann of Wall, Sus­
ie Kothmann of Menard, 
Shelly Spiller and Kim Sch­
wartz of Junction, Kristal 
Williams and Sherri Buckner 
of Ozona, Karen Moore and 
Ann Garza of Fort Stock- 
ton, Sarah Hernandez and Jo 
Mitchell of Crane. LaWonza 
Mitchell of Crane was named 
most valuable player.

A new award. The Ster­
ling Lay Memorial Sports­
manship Award, in memory 
of former Ozona basketball 
player Sterling Lay was pre­
sented this year. A plaque, 
donated by Sterling’s par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Lay, will be placed in the 
school trophy case bearing 
the names of the award 
winners each year. In addi­

tion, each winner will be 
awarded a trophy. The reci­
pients of the award were 
selected by the tournament 
referees and will be based on 
the players’ on-court demea­
nor and relationship with 
teammates, opponents and 
the officials themselves.

Following this tourna­
ment, the award went to 
David Vargas of Ozona and 
LaWonza Mitchell of Crane.

Annual County 4-H 
Food Show results
The Annual Crockett 

County 4-H Food Show was 
held Saturday, December 10 
with fifty-four 4-H members 
competing for top awards. 
4-Hers were judged on pro­
ject records, menus, and 
judge’s interviews. First 
place winners in each junior 
and senior category were se­
lected to represent Crockett 
County in district competi­
tion March 31 in Odessa.

Representatives for dis­
trict competition will be Terr- 
ie Willmon, junior breads 
and cereals; Robin Myers, 
junior fruits and vegetables; 
Treble West, junior main 
dish; Jason Montgomery, 
junior nutritious snacks and 
desserts; Tonya Carter, sen­
ior main dish; and Susan 
Scott, senior snacks and des­
serts.

The newest category for 
eight-year-olds was entered 
by seven enthusiastic girls. 
In the Bread and Cereal 
category, Bonnie Martin re­
ceived a trophy, first place 
rosette, and blue award, and 
Jessica Deaton received a 
second place rosette and red 
award. In the Fruits and 
Vegetables category, Jenni­
fer Jones received a trophy, 
first place rosette, and red 
award and Amy Easterwood 
was awarded a second place 
rosette and red award. In 
nutritious snacks and des­
serts, Whitney Vannoy re­
ceived a trophy, first place 
rosette and blue award. Sec­
ond place rosette and red 
award were presented to 
Heather Nichol Kemp and 
third place rosette and red 
award to Leesa Haire.

The junior category was 
for 4-H members, ages 9-13.

In the Junior Breads and 
Cereals category, awards 
were as follows:

Terrie Willmon, trophy, 
first rosette, blue award. 
Haley Carson, second ro­
sette, blue award; Carri 
Chandler, third rosette, blue 
award; Courtney Childress, 
blue award; Jennifer Colin, 
red award; Tanya Ramos, 
white award.

Junior Fruits and Vege­
table awards were presented 
as follows: Robin Myers, 
trophy, first rosette, blue 
award; Tamel West, second 
rosette, blue award; Sabrina 
Easterwood, third rosette, 
blue award; Tondra Hensley, 
blue award; Susan Pullen, 
blue award; Kelly Williams, 
blue award; Jennifer David­
son, red award; Ann Trull, 
red award; Valerie Flores, 
white award.

In the Junior Main Dish 
category the following were 
winners: Trebie West, tro­
phy, first rosette, blue aw­
ard; Marandy Keith, second 
rosette, blue award; Mary 
Turnley, third rosette, blue; 
Missy Bishop, blue award; 
third rosette, blue award; 
Missy Bishop, blue award; 
Sarah Pullen, blue award; 
Danette Robinson, red 
award; Summer Shacklette, 
red award; Stacy Skains, red 
award; Christy Cotton, white 
award; Luis Rico, white 
award.

The Junior Snacks and 
Desserts category was the 
largest with 17 entries. Aw­
ards were presented to: Ja­
son Montgomery, trophy, 
first rosette, blue award;
Tamie Reagor, second ro­
sette, blue award; Julie Car- 
son, third rosette, blue aw­

ard; Tammy Arrott, blue 
award; Carmen Borrego, 
blue award; Misty Fowler, 
blue award; Stacey Poage, 
blue award; Ami Sewell, blue 
award; Veronica Vasquez, 
blue award; Rita Garza, red 
award; Debra Gonzales, red 
award; Michelle Lambert, 
red award; Kim McBrier, red 
award; Kelly Porter, red
award; Elvia Vasquez, red
award; Tracy Ybarra, red
award; Angie M arshall, 
white award.

In the senior main dish 
category there were three
entries. Awards were pre­
sented to Tonya Carter, sil­
ver tray, first rosette, red 
award; Norma Vasquez, sec­
ond rosette, white award; 
Kim Baker, third rosette, 
white award.

In the senior nutritious 
snacks and desserts, Susan 
Scott received a silver tray, 
first rosette and blue award. 
Mary Lou Hayes was award­
ed a second rosette and white 
award.

Local businesses were re­
sponsible for donating the 
trophies, silver trays, cookie 
cutters, ribbons and paper 
supplies. These donors were 
Baggett Agency, Baker’s 
Jewelers, Brown’s Furni­
ture, Qayton’s Village Drug, 
Crockett County National 
Bank, Southwest Texas Elec­
tric Cooperative, Jim’s Food­
way, Maxine’s Flowers, Ozo­
na National Bank, Ozona Tel­
evision System, Thornton’s 
Supermarket, Watson’s Dep­
artment Store.

Chairmen of the 4-H Food 
Show were Sharman West 
and Lou Haire. Other leadersf

CONTINUED ON PG. 8

Commissioners in 
routine meeting

The Crockett County Com­
missioners Court met in reg­
ular session Monday for a 
brief but routine monthly 
meeting. After bills were ap­
proved for payment, various 
reports were given by var­
ious county departm ent 
heads.

Henry Elledge gave the 
road department report, tell­
ing the court removing fol­
iage which obscures stop 
signs is keeping his men 
busy. He also reported in­
stalling new signs where a 
street ends.

Judge Fields reported on a 
meeting concerning juvenile 
detention in San Angelo last 
week. Commissioner B.W. 
Stuart accompanied the 
judge. San Angelo officials 
asked ten counties in the 
area to assist with the build­
ing of a juvenile center, to 
comply with a law which goes 
into effect next year in 
December. The law forbids 
juveniles being held in the 
same facility with adults. No 
action was taken on the 
matter since Crockett County 
is in the Permian Basin 
Juvenile District and the 
court felt it should go along 
with whatever that district 
decides.

A motion was made to pay 
election clerks at the rate of 
$4 per hour and the election 
judges an extra $25 to deliver 
the boxes to the courthouse. 
All voted in favor.

The judge asked the court 
to approve the attendance of 
the county service officer, 
Raymond Davee, at a V.A. 
school, also a Peace Justice 
school, which is mandatory. 
All members voted approval.

Some discussion was held 
on automobiles for the Sher­
iff’s Department. The de­
partment has six cars, but 
have indicated a need for 
seven. It was decided to 
discuss this matter with 
Sheriff Billy Mills.

County Auditor Dick Kirby 
informed the court he had 
received a letter from the 
State informing him the 
county must make all county 
facilities available to the 
l^andicapped. This includes 
the blind, the deaf and the 
crippled, to avoid discrimi­
nation. Some discussion was 
held on the subject, and 
Kirby was asked to report 
further after he received 
some kind of guidelines.

Dan Pullen, chairman of

the hospital board, and Don 
Hopkins, administrator, met 
to give the hospital report 
and ask the court to give 
them permission to bring suit 
against those with bad debts.

Pullen said he felt it was 
unfair for people who could 
pay to disregard hospital 
bills and others, who have 
very little income, faithfully 
come in monthly and pay $5 
or $10 on their bills.

Hopkins passed a list of 
bad debtors to the court 
members, informing them 
the hospital had $450,000 in 
bad debts. Hopkins said 
many had not paid because 
their insurance did not pay as 
much as they thought it 
should. He added that every 
patient was responsible for 
their deductible as well as 
the part of the claim not paid 
by their insurance carrier.

Pullen assured the court 
the hospital board was not 
trying to push those who 
cannot afford to pay, but 
expects those who can to pay 
their past-due hospital bills. 
The court voted to take the 
bad debts through Small

Claims Court.
Elizabeth Upham gave the 

Civic and Youth Center re­
port, reminding the court 
that new members must be 
appointed next month. She 
also advised that the board 
had amended their consti­
tution to allow three-year 
terms and if a member 
misses three consecutive 
meetings without due cause, 
a new member will be ap­
pointed to fill the vacancy, 
adding the board needs 
members who really want to 
be on the board and is 
interested in the center.

Bids were opened for 
county insurance at 11:00 
o’clock. The Baggett Agency 
represented by Jack Bag­
gett, submitted a bid of 
$16,679 which was the low 
bid for the auto fleet pre­
mium, and the Elizabeth 
Upham Agency, represented 
by Mrs. Upham, submitted a 
bid of $2500 for the umbrel­
la coverage, which was the 
low bid for that coverage. 
The court accepted both low 
bids.

The court adjourned short­
ly before noon.

American Justice, 
concludes this week
The following article is a 

public service by the Ozona 
Stockman through the coop­
eration of Bill Mason, Dist­
rict Attorney and Tom Cam­
eron, County Attorney of the 
112th Judicial District. Its 
purpose is to make you aware 
of a prosecutor’s role, of your 
responsibility as a resident of 
Crockett County and how we 
can work together to alle­
viate some of society’s prob­
lems.

Here is the last part of an 
article to increase your know­
ledge of the operation and 
effect of the American Jus­
tice system.

The right to remain silent 
and to have a lawyer pres­
ent is a fact which a police­
man must tell a person 
before the policeman ques­
tions the person as a crimi­
nal suspect. The purpose 
here is to insure a person of 
his constitutional right 
against self-incrimination.

A defendant can plead 
guilty at any time before the 
verdict is in. This system 
encourages the defendant’s

plea at any point prior to his 
conviction or acquittal.

The job of a grand jury is 
to decide whether there is 
sufficient evidence for a trial. 
If there is sufficient evi­
dence to sustain the charg­
es, the grand jury delivers an 
indictment formally charging 
the defendant. W hether 
there is enough evidence to 
sustain a conviction is up to 
the trial jury.

The standard used by jur­
ies to decide a criminal case 
is guilt beyond a reasona­
ble doubt. Our system seeks 
at all costs to avoid con­
demning an innocent person. 
Juries should be very sure of 
a defendant’s guilt before 
they convict. By comparison, 
the standard in a civil case is 
the preponderance of the evi­
dence. Here the jury simply 
determines which side-plain­
tiff or defendant-has the 
weight of the evidence be­
hind him. Imagine a balance 
scale, with the evidence for 
one party on one side and for 
the other party on the oppo- 
CONTINUED ON PAGE 9

SANTA WAS IN TOWN Monday mak­
ing rounds in Ozona. Spmisored by the 
lions Qaby Santa vidted rosldents of 
the Caro Cmitm*, Cmnmanity Center

and Day Care Center. Visiting in the 
Ozona Primary School Library, he 
passes out candy canes as he did to all.
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TV’S NUCLEAR 
HOLOCAUST
By Edwin Feulner

If you were a youngster in the 1950s, as I was, you 
probably knew people who had bomb shelters in their 
basement, or at least had considered installing one. But 
you were unlikely to have lived in fear of “ the bomb.” 
In .school, there were air raid drills as well as fire drills, 
but nobody tried to convince you that the end of the world 
was in sight.

And certainly nobody tried to convince you that the 
United States was responsible for a pending nuclear 
holocaust because we didn’t have the vision to disarm 
ourselves and beg for mercy from the Soviet Union.

Ah, the good old days. All that has changed now, 
thanks to ABC television and their broadcast of “ The Day 
After,” a made-for-TV movie aired November 20.

“ The Day After”  (which starred Jason Robards) was 
not a sleazy sex film. It wasn’t even a classy one. It featured 
the residents of Kansas City, Missouri, and Lawrence, 
Kansas, in a grisly and graphic look at life on earth during 
and after a nuclear attack.

The film sought to be terrorizing. But to a nation jaded 
by “ The Towering Inferno” and “ Jaws,” it was 
disappointingly dull. I’m almost tempted to say ABC’s 
nuclear holocaust was one big bomb, creating an audience 
where the bored envied the dead.

ABC almost took a bath showing the $7 million 
program. Sponsors were reluctant to touch such a (excuse 
the expression) “ hot” property. But ABC executive 
Anthony Thomopoulos stressed the network’s commitment 
to airing the film regardless of how many sponsors signed 
on.

For anyone familiar with the entertainment industry, 
this seems (xld. In a business where profits are the be-all 
and end-all of existence, no one goes around throwing 
millions of dollars down the tubes. After all, SOMEONE 
has to pay for the Guccis, the Mercedes, and the tab at 
Perino’s. So what was ABC’s motive—if not another fast 
buck.

Despite the denials, it looks like the real purpose of 
the film was the desire by ABC executives to make a 
political statement: “ disarm or die—support the nuclear 
freeze!”

Why el.se would they have scheduled it to air just as 
NATO was starting its deployment of Pershing 11 and cruise 
missiles in Europe—missiles that were requested by our 
allies to make the Soviets think twice about using the 
hundreds of missiles they have aimed at Europe?

Star Robards let the cat out of the bag when he 
commented that making the film “ beats signing petitions.” 
And pro-freeze groups, in virtual hiding since the Kremlin 
again revealed its barbarism by shooting down Korean Air 
Lines Flight (X)7, were ecstatic. “ ABC is doing a $7 million 
advertising job for our issue,”  said Janet Michaud, leader 
of a pro-freeze group.

Sadly, the joke may be on the fearmongers. If the movie 
has the impact they’re hoping for, and the U.S. opts for 
unilateral disarmament, they may indeed get their 
holocaust.

Why? Because deterrence works and appeasement 
doesn’t. We didn’t worry about nuclear annihilation in the 
50s because our nation was strong. Nuclear war was 
unthinkable because the aggressors in the Soviet Politburo 
knew the U.S. was determined to defend its interests. So 
Khruschev and company never pushed the button.

Temple Baptist Church
1506 Willow St., 

Sunday....10 o.m., 7:30 p.m.

Wednesday.........7n30 p.m.
Coll 392-2951

WORKING MAN’S CHURCH 
WITH A HEART FOR THE FAMH^Y.”

By Lyndell Williams 
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AUSTIN—Every candi­
date needs a viable issue 
he or she can develop to 
stand out among the fad 
political issues which 
bloom prior to elections 
or legislative sessions, and 
Texas Comptroller Bob 
Bullock last week pin­
pointed one which may 
become a winner.

Pointing out that Texas 
produces 30 times more 
industrial hazardous wastes 
than it produces cotton, 
Bullock said the Lone Star 
State is “fouling its nest” 
and needs to crack down 
on waste disposal practices.

One of the first things 
Texans need to do is to 
raise the tax on the pro­
ducers of hazardous 
wastes, to pay for cleaning 
up the mess already made 
and to deter out-of-state 
producers from shipping 
more of their wastes to 
Texas.

At $30 a ton, the Texas 
permit fee to dispose of 
hazardous wastes is the 
lowest in the nation. The 
typical range across the 
nation is between $500 
and $1,000 a ton, with 
Tennessee topping the 
chart at $10,000 a ton.

Since Texas has a con­
siderable number of waste 
sites, most of them near 
the Gulf Coast chemical 
plants, Bullock says, an 
updated hazardous waste 
tax could raise up to $50 
million per year to clean 
up the dumps and still be 
among the lowest in the 
nation.

Not a Stunt
Bullock, of course, is 

planning to run for gov­
ernor in 1986 and he 
needs good issues for that 
task. But his serious work 
on the development and 
presentation of this issue 
is not a stunt, and it hints 
of a departure from what 
is Bullock’s usual style.

Generally regarded by 
friend and foe alike as one 
of the most knowledge­
able state officials, and 
generally avoided and un­
molested by candidates 
seeking higher office, Bul­
lock can be cocky and 
combative with a dash of 
parody. Lately, the old 
Bullock has been seen less 
and less, and a serious, 
determined Bullock has 
emerged.

Teacher Pay Raise
Teachers’ lobbyists are 

still pushing for Gov. 
Mark White to call the 
Legislature into special 
session this summer to 
raise their salaries, but Lt. 
Gov. Bill Hobby last week 
predicted the issue is dead 
until 1985.

Salaries cannot be raised 
unless legislators raise 
taxes, and Hobby doesn’t 
consider that likely in an 
election year.

White is still waiting for 
a Select Committee to 
finish its study of the state 
public educational system, 
and he has indicated he 
will poll legislators after 
the committee’s final re­
port.

If lawmakers support a 
tax hike/salary hike, he 
will call them into special 
session.

In any event, the issue 
is likely to enjoy lively 
debate in the 1985 regular 
legislative session.

Veterans Home Loans
Last week the Veterans 

Land Board announced 
hhe sale of $85 million in 
bonds to provide mortgage

financing at less than 10 
percent for Texas veterans.

The winning bid was 
submitted by First Boston 
Corp. of New York The 
sale represents part of a 
$500 million housing 
bond package approved

by voters last month.
Land Commissioner 

Garry Mauro called the 
low bid a “great Christ­
mas present for our Texas 
veterans,” and promised 
the loans will be avail­
able before the holiday.

Public Notice

SHERIFF’S NOTICE 
OF SALE

By virtue of an order of 
sale issued by the Clerk of 
the District Court of Crock­
ett County, Texas pursuant 
to a Judgment in Cause No. 
4587, styled Live Oak Drill­
ing Company, Inc., vs Sagi 
Petroleum Corporation in the 
112th District Court of 
Crockett County, Texas. I 
did, on the 6th day of 
December, 1983, levy upon 
and seize the oil and gas 
interests of Sagi Petroleum 
Corporation in the following 
land in Crockett County, 
Texas:

The East one-half (E/2) of 
the Southwest quarter 
(SW/4) of the Northwest 
quarter (NW/4) of Section 
15, Block 1, GC&SF Survey;

The East one-half (E/Jt) 
of the Northwest quarter 
(NW/4) of the Northeast 
quarter (NE/4) of Section 15, 
Block 1, GC&SF Survey;

The East one-half (E/2) of 
the Northeast quarter (NE/4) 
of the Northeast quarter 
(NE/4) of Section 15, Block 
1, GC&SF Survey.

E/2 SE/4 SW/4, Sec. 17, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.
Survey;

E/2 SE/4 SE/4, Sec. 17, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.
Survey;

N/2 SW/4 SW/4, Sec. 18, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.
Survey;

W/2 SE/4 SW/4, Sec. 18, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.
Survey;

W/2 NE/4 NE/4, Sec. 16, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.
Survey;

NW/4 NW/4. Sec. 4,
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co.
Survey.

The West one-half of the 
Southeast quarter of the 
Northeast quarter (W/2 of 
SE/4 of NE/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co.
Survey

The West one-half of the 
Southwest quarter of the 
Northeast quarter (W/2 of 
SW/4 of NE/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co.
Survey

The East one-half of the 
Southeast quarter of the 
Southwest quarter (E/2 of 
SE/4 of SW/4) of Section 18, 
Block 1, GC&SF Survey

The West one-half of the 
Southeast quarter of the 
Northwest quarter (W/2 of 
SE/4 of NW/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey

The West one-half of the 
Northeast quarter of the 
Southwest quarter (W/2 of 
NE/4 of SW/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey

The West one-half of the 
Southeast quarter Of the 
Southwest quarter (W/2 of 
SE/4 of SW/4) of Section 4. 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey

The East one-half of the 
Northeast quarter of the 
Northwest quarter (E/2 of 
NE/4 of NW/4) of Section 3, 
Block FF. B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey

The East one-half of the 
Southwest quarter of the 
Northeast quarter (E/2 of 
SW/4 of NE/4) of Section 15, 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co.

Survey, Crockett County, 
Texas

NOTICE OF APPUCATION 
FOR OIL AND GAS WASTE 
DISPOSAL WELL PERMIT

McCurdy Oil Company, 
2525 Ridgmar Blvd., Room 
300, Ft. Worth, Tex. 76116 
has applied to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a 
permit to dispose of pro­
duced salt water or other oil 
and gas waste by well injec­
tion into a porous forma­
tion not productive of oil or 
gas.

The applicant proposes to 
dispose of oil and gas waste 
into the San Andres Jeff 
Owens, Well Number 10. 
The proposed disposal well is 
located 18 S.E. of Iraan, Tex. 
in the Clara Couch Field, in 
Crockett County. The waste 
water will be injected into 
strata in the subsurface 
depth interval from 1800 to 
1803 feet.

LEGAL AUTHORITY: 
Chapter 27 of the Texas 
Water Code, as amended. 
Title 3 of the Natural Re­
sources Code, as amended, 
and the Statewide Rules of 
the Oil and Gas Division of 
the Railroad Commission of 
Texas.

Requests for a public hear­
ing from persons who can 
show they are adversely af­
fected, or requests for fur­
ther information concerning 
any aspect of the applica­
tion should be submitted in 
writing, within fifteen days 
of publication, to the Under­
ground Injection Control Sec­
tion, Oil and Gas Division, 
Railroad Commission of Tex­
as, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445-1373).

42-ltc

The Newsreel
A rc-run of “ The Ozona Story” as gleaned from 
the flics of the "The Oz.ona Stockman”

Hiandjiy, Dec. 16, 1954
Final contracts have been 

signed and orders placed for 
cable, amplifiers and other 
equipment in readiness for 
beginning the work of install­
ing the community television 
system for Ozona.

29 y n . ago
Ozona Rotary Club will 

award prizes to the four most 
original Christmas displays 
set up by Ozona residents 
this season.

29yrs. ago
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Rich­

ardson who ranch near So­
nora are the parents of twin 
boys bom in the Crockett 
County Hospital Sunday.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Lions won consola­

tion at the Del Rio Tour­
nament. Ronnie McMullan 
led in the opening contest 
with 15 points while Jody 
Jones, Bobby Martinez and 
Johnny Ramirez all had from 
10 to 12 points.

29 yrs. ago
Jack O’Neal Whitley is a

AG Asked to Resign
The state Republican 

Party called on Texas At­
torney General Jim Mat­
tox to resign or step aside 
until he resolves his guilt 
or innocence on a com­
mercial bribery charge.

Mattox won’t do either, 
and responded that Re­
publicans are too aligned 
with his nemesis, Mobil

The East one-half of the 
Southeast quarter of the 
Northeast quarter (E/2 of 
SE/4 of NE/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey, Crockett County, 
Texas

The East one-half of the 
Southwest quarter of the 
Northeast quarter (E/2 of 
SW/4 of NE/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey, Crockett County, 
Texas

The East one-half of the 
Southeast quarter of the 
Northwest quarter (E/2 of 
SE/4 of NW/4) of Section 4, 
Block FF, B&B Ry. Co. 
Survey, Crockett County, 
Texas

The West one-half of the 
Southwest quarter of the 
Southwest quarter (W/2 of 
SW/4 of SW/4) of Section 1 
Block 1, GC&SF Ry. Co. 
Survey, Crockett County, 
Texas

And on the 3rd day of 
January, 1984, being the first 
Tuesday of the said month, 
between the hours of 10:00 
a.m. and 4:00 p.m., at the 
Courthouse Door of Crockett 
County, Texas, I will offer 
the said interest for sale and 
sell them at public auction to 
the highest bidder.

Billy Mills
Sheriff, Crockett
County, Texas

41-3tc

Oil and other big oil com­
panies.

Meanwhile, true to his 
public style of champion­
ing the small consumer 
against the conglomerates 
and giants, Mattox last 
week attacked the staff of 
the Public Utility Com­
mission for being too soft 
on Southwestern Bell.

The phone company is 
seeking a $1.3 billion rate 
hike from the PUC, and 
Mattox was incensed by 
the staff’s recommenda­
tion of a 15.5 percent rate 
of return.

PUC chairman A1 Erwin 
rebutted Mattox’s criti­
cism and said the Mattox 
letter to the three PUC 
commissioners violated a 
state law that forbids pri­
vate communications be­
tween commissioners and 
persons active in legal pro­
ceedings before them.

Odds and Ends
Former Attorney Gen­

eral John Hill has over 
$100,000 in his campaign 
fund to run for Texas Su­
preme Court Chief Justice 
next year, but he is hold­
ing off cementing his cam­
paign organization until 
he finds out who his op­
ponent will be.

Texas L,and Commis­
sioner Mauro spent much 
of last week in New York 
working for a settlement 
of the $1.7 billion oil roy­
alty lawsuit against Mobil 
Oil Corp.

State Rep. Jim Rudd, 
D-Brownfield, may be the 
leading contender to re­
place retiring Appropria­
tions chairman Bill Pres- 
nal. Other contenders are 
Jay Gibson, D-Odessa, 
and Doyle Willis, D-Fort 
Worth.

STOCKMAN CLASSIFIEDS 
GET RESULTS.

new member of Sigma Gam­
ma Epsilon professional 
earth sciences fraternity at 
University of Texas.

29 yrs. ago
Members of the water 

board who are up for election 
to another term are Sherman 
Taylor, W.E. Friend, Jr. and 
Gene Williams. Hold-overs 
are Lowell Littleton and 
James Baggett.

29 yrs. ago
Members of the Advisory 

Council of the Ozona Com­
munity Center met to plan a 
financial drive on behalf of 
the center to erase an indebt­
edness which resulted from 
the flood and to seek new 
pledges to bolster the sup­
port fund for the institution.

29 yrs. ago
For the benefit of needy 

children in Ozona the Rotary 
Club will stage a two-day 
sale of Christmas corsages.

29 yrs. ago

The Woman’s Society of 
Christian Service met with 
Mrs. R.A. Harrell. Mrs. 
Charles Williams, Sr. told 
the Christmas Story and 
Mrs. Byron Williams sang a 
solo.

29 yrs. ago
The OHS band traveled to 

Abilene for All Regional 
Band tryouts. Don Lott, 
Charles Sowders and Dwight 
Odom were eligible to at­
tend. They all made the 
band.

29 yrs. ago
Mrs. W.H. Whitaker hon- 

orer her daughter Sandra 
with a dance at the Country 
Club on her birthday. The 
sixth grade were the invited 
guests.

29 yrs. ago
The Ozona Music Qub met 

in the home of Mrs. V.I. 
Pierce.

29 yrs. ago
Beta Rho chapter of Ep­

silon Sigma Alpha held the 
annual Christmas party at 
the country club. Hostesses 
were Mrs. James Isbell, 
Mrs. Taylor Deaton, Mrs. 
Charles Ratliff, and Mrs. 
Wayne E. West.

Letters to 
the Editor

Dear Kitty and Willa,
Just a line to thank each of 

you for all the publicity you 
gave us for our bazaar for 
league. Without the pictures 
and articles, we couldn’t do 
half as good. Thanks a 
million.

Sincerely, 
Jane Richardson

iMfm

fh iks  of

REWARD
|I am offering

*500 Reward

Sheriff, Crockett Co.

Billy Mills

R-K Auto Parts
Full line

Of Automotive Parts 

Try us,
you'll like our prices

STANDARD IGNITION PARTS 

AUTOLITiAND CHAMPION 

SPARKPLUGS

Open Weekdays 7:30 a.m. - 6:00 p.m. 

Saturday 7:30 a.m. - 3:00 p.m.

nOOAve.S. 392-2616 

Mights 392-3479 or 392-2360

O zona

B u sin ess

A nd
P ro fe ss io n a l

Guide

for apprehension and convic­
tion of guilty parties to every 

^heft of livestock In Crockett 
County - except that no 
officer of Crockett County 
may claim (he reward.

OZONA DAY 
CARE CENTER 

Methodist Church 
PHONE 392-3641 
BIRTH TO 13 YRS. 
fulltime or drop-in 

7:45 a.m. to 6 p.m.

1

WELDING 
General and Oilfield 

Diesel Service 
24 Hr. Service 
Ph. 392-3029

VILLAGE BARBER SHOP 
Regular Haircuts 

Razor Cuts-Layer Cuts 
and Men’s Hair Styling 

Jim Caldwell

WHITEHOUSE CO. 
GULF PRODUCTS 
Hunting Supplies 

Deer Leases
Ph. 392-3912. 705-11th St, 

6:00 a.m.-10:00 p.m.

MAXINE’S 
FLOWER SHOP 

Fresh Cut-Pot Plants 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

CAMERAS TWO 
Photography and 

Frame Shop 
404 Ave. J 
392-2256

VFW POST 6109 
Regular Meetings 

Third Tuesday 
In Each Month 

8 P.M.

OZONA BUTANE CO. 
Propane Gas 

Sales and Service 
1108 Ave. E 
Ph. 392-3013

THE LINE 
Party Merchant 
14 Ml. E off I-10 

Bcer-Liquor-Winc 
Ph. 387-2956

THE BAGGETT AGENCY 
Insurance 

Your Protection 
is our Profession 

1114 Ave. E-392-2606

‘Everything for the Home 
at

BROWN FURNITURE CO. 
906 Ave. E 

Ph. 392-2341

J.W. MOTOR PARTS

k̂Uto Parts & Supplies 
606 11th St. 

392-2343

FIRST BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Dr. S.N. La.nham, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 
Evening Worship 7:00 
Prayer Service Wed.7:30

OZONA LODGE 747

Slated meetings-first 
Mon. of month, 7:30 p.m. 
Study-each Thursday

POTTER’S WHEEL 
CERAMICS 

104A Live Oak Drive 
Ph. 392-2548 

Hrs. 1-5, Mon-Fri.

SKAIN’S GARAGE 
Welding & General Repair 

24 Hr. Wrecker Service
392-3110 392-3505

WANTED
All singles to attmid the 

growing singles dass, 
First Baptist Churdi 
Sunday—9:45 a.m.

SPORT SHACK 
T-Shirts-Transfers 

Dccr Leases 
1102 Ave. 1392-3382

B&C AUTOMOTIVE 
Complete Auto Repair 

& Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 
403-1st Street

(
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The Season’s Best For You
Jim 's

Foodwoy
PRICES EFFECTIVE THURSDAY, DEC. 15th thru MONDAY, DEC 19th ***'*!SoiveS**”

SMOKEDUSDA CHOICE "P.S .”

ROUND
STEAK

VACUUM PACKED

SLICED 
BACON

"ORDER YOUR FRUIT" 
BASKET-NOW 

1 / 2  B d .  $ 1 5 9 5

with Grapefruit 

1/2 Bu. with Pears $1795

PECKSIZE $ 1 1 ^ 5

LIFEBUOY

SOAP
BATH SIZE 39
KLEENEX

TISSUE
250 CT. .99

SELECTED

USDA CHOICE BEEF CEHTER CUT

ROUND STEAK BONELESS

GOOD VALUE - WAFER THIN .  _

SLICED MEATS .49
e . WHOLE HOG COUNTRY STYLE

^  SAUSAGE io?L

USDA CHOICE BONELESS

RUMP 
ROAST

0 U N k L k »

$189
LB. ■ ■

MEATY

SOUP
BONES

GRANULATED

GooA*

SUGAR

A LL GRINDS COFFEE

MARYLAND
CLUB

WASHDAY FAVORITE

TIDE
DETERGENT

49-OZ.
BOX

100% PURE

MAZOLA 
CORN OIL

48-OZ.
BTL

CHOCOLATE FLAVOR

NESTLE QUIK
ASSORTED

JOB SQUAD TOWELS

32-OZ. 
CAN

JUMBO 
ROLL

Paper Lunch

Chinet Plates :wU
$169

Quaker

Masa Marina
T V. Brand

Pineapple Juice
Purina

Chuck Wagon

5-Lb.
Bag

46-Oz.
Can

$109

$029

.75
Powdered Sugar 
Marshmallow Creme 69
Halves or Pieces

Sunshine Pecans

YOUR CHOICE:

RANCH STYLE CHILI
COMSTOCK

APPLE PIE FILLING

NO BEANS 
WITH BEANS

19-02 .
CAN

21-OZ. 
CAN

.79

.95
IMPERIAL Red Label

Dog
Food 25-Lb.

Bag

1
l|. aiHAA Maramor Carob

’7’’ Baking Chips 12-Oz.
Pkg.

Karo Svrup
30c OFF LABEL

Palmolive
Pink Fabric Softener

Sta Puiff Liquid

For
Dishes

A ^  ^ F a b r i c  Softener

U * ’ sta Puff Sheets

_________ TEXAS RUBY RED

GRAPEFRUIT

LARGE
SIZE

RICH IN FLAVOR

TEXAS YAMS
CALIFORNIA NAVEL

ORANGES
LOW IN CALORIES

CAULIFLOWER
FRESH & TENDER

BROCCOLI
California

Carrots
Ocean Spray

Cranberries

/  ^6
New Crop

29 Tangerines
^  RED DEUCIOUS

89 Apples
BAG

12-Oz. 
Bag I

3 LB. 
BAG

3
.99

PET-RITZ FROZEN

DEEP DISH PIE SHELLS
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED-AMERICAN

GENERIC SLICED CHEESE

----------------------------------------1

PKG. 7 Q  
of 2 ■ f ^

12-OZ. 7 0  
PKG. ■ 1 ^

GOLDEN QUARTERS

JJMPERIAL MARGARINE 5 9ILB. CTN. # 0 #  #

I S bUTTERMILK or HOMESTYLE C /$ 1 0 0
8-OZ. TUBE 1

I^KIDUEFUKD-FROZEN

PARKER HOUSE ROLLS PKG. OF 24 o 8 9
PET RITZ-FROZEN

PUMPKIN PIES $119
26 0Z. CTN. ^  1

916 ir̂ STREEt OZONAJEX
. . .  HOME OWNED i  OPERATED

STORE HOURS 
7t30A.M.-6:00P.M.

MON..SAT. 
CLOSED SUNDAY

2 ^

UNITED
SUPERS
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Tips For Gardeners
From The Ozona Garden 
Club by Mrs. Bailey Post

Garden Club enjoys a 

Christmas luncheon
Extension office news

By-Rachel Hall

I’m sure all of you are 
enjoying the many ways in 
which you can celebrate the 
Christmas season with your 
families and friends.

Be sure and make a tour of 
our home town, churches, 
streets, parks and many at­
tractive and beautiful dis­
plays at the homes.

Perhaps an expression of 
appreciation to those who 
have planned and helped in 
anyway with the decorations, 
would encourage continued 
participation in civic activi­
ties.

The Chamber of Com­
merce, commissioners court, 
business concerns and var­
ious individuals in Ozona 
take the lead in planning and 
obtaining the decorations 
used, adding some new ones 
each year.

Mr. Keiler and his crew of 
helpers from the water dist­
rict assume the responsibil­
ity of arranging the many 
different items over town. 
They don't hesitate to get 
them up at the appointed 
date, even though it may be 
raining or very cold. Then 
they spend many hours tak­
ing them down to store them.

Also, the churches display 
decorations and scenes de­
picting the Christmas story 
each year, some made by the 
youth groups.

The Ozona Garden Club 
sponsors the Nativity Scene 
in Live Oak Park on Hwy. 
290. Again this is arranged 
each year by the waterworks 
crew. The late Mahlon Ro­
bertson was the artist who 
painted the first figures. In 
1969 Mrs. Wayne E. West 
painted the three wise men 
to add to the group. Mr. Bob 
Wallace and some of his 
class cut out the figures for 
her to paint.

Also, our thanks to the 
County Park crew for keep­
ing the parks well-groomed 
throughout the year. Many 
tourists expression express

GARDEN OF THE MONTH

The Home of 
BASCOMB COX 

906 Angus

As selected by
OZONA GARDEN CLUB

in person or write in after 
passing through, their many 
compliments on our attrac­
tive and beautiful little city.

The merchants have put 
forth a special effort to 
present attractive and color­
ful windows and interiors to 
display their bountiful gifts 
and merchandise to encour­
age trading at home.

Catholic
Christmas
activities

Communial Penance Ser­
vice Monday, Dec. 19 at 7 
p.m. will begin the Christ­
mas activities at Our Lady of 
Perpetual Help Catholic 
Church. A number of visit­
ing priests will be availa­
ble for individual confes­
sions.

Christmas evening mass 
will be held December 24, at 
11 p.m. and will be pre­
ceded by a caroling program 
at 10:30.

The Christmas morning 
mass will be held Sunday 
Dec. 25, at 11:15 a.m. The 
annual Christmas dance will 
be held December 25, from 
8:00 to 12:00. Music will be 
furnished by the All Stars 
featuring El Charo Negro.

Advance tickets may be 
purchased at the Catholic 
Rectory or at the Nato Tam- 
bunga residence until Fri­
day, Dec. 23.

Methodists 
to present 
cantata

The choir of the Ozona 
United Methodist Church 
will present a cantata, 
“Yuletide Memories,” Sun­
day evening, Dec. 18, at 
7:30.

Well-known melodies are 
combined with new songs to 
present the Christmas story 
from prophecy to the birth of 
Jesus. Several soloists and a 
choir of girls will join the 
senior choir as they celebrate 
this sacred and joyous sea­
son of the year.

The public is cordially 
invited.

Members of the Ozona 
Garden Club met in the home 
of Mrs. David Weant Mon­
day, Dec. 12. Assisting hos­
tess was Mrs. Joey Pierce.

A Christmas luncheon was 
enjoyed by members and 
guests.

The business meeting was 
called to order by Mrs. Bill 
Mason and various com­
mittee reports were given. 
The Triangle Park and the 
grounds around the court­
house annex have been 
cleaned and a spring clean­
up was discussed.

Mrs. Bailey Post reviewed 
the Lone Star and National 
Gardener. Mrs. J. W. How­
ell was presented a life

membership to Texas Gar­
den Club.

The home was decorated 
with Christmas arrange­
ments using madonnas made 
by different garden club 
members.

Mrs. Joe Bean reviewed 
the book “ The Madonna 
Story.”

Others attending were 
Mrs. Boyd Baker, Mrs. Ar­
nold Gerlack, Mrs. Lee 
Graves, Mrs. Leonard Hill­
man, Mrs. J. W. Howell, 
Mrs. Dee Keilers, Mrs. Mike 
Ledoux, Mrs. J. B. Miller, 
Mrs. Mike Miller, Mrs. Bee­
cher Montgomery, Mrs. Tom 
Stokes and Mrs. Charles 
Williams.

Civic and Youth Center 
directors in meeting

The Board of Directors of 
the Crockett County Civic 
and Youth Center met on 
Wednesday, December 7, 
with the following members 
present: Elizabeth Upham, 
Alice Lopez, Belinda Wil­
kins, Ann Childress and Gar­
land Young. The council 
member present was Susan 
Scott. The following are the 
new members of the Teen 
Council: Freshmen, Tod Fos­
ter and Jennifer Probst; So­
phomores, Amy Jones and 
Andy Dews; Juniors, Susan 
Scott and Terrye Abbott; 
Seniors, Dennis Young and 
Krystal Williams.

The Valentine Dance will 
be held on February 11, 
1984. It was decided to get 
Deja Vu to play for the 
dance. The council was dis­
missed.

Mrs. Upham is checking 
on the price of a sign for the 
building to read, “Crockett 
County Civic and Youth Cen­
ter.”

The window in the small 
room still needs to be fixed, 
it was reported.

Young reported all the 
pool tables have been repair­
ed and recovered. He is also 
checking on the price of a 
new bumper pool table. He 
also reported that the two 
video games need repairs 
and they have not been kept 
up like they should have 
been. The board is checking 
on a new source to supply 
them. Also checking on the

price of two new or used 
pinball machines.

The board is pricing a new 
Bunn double-drip coffee pot. 
Jim Williams will contact the 
DeCoty coffee man and Mrs. 
Childress is checking with 
Angelo Refrigeration and 
Restaurant Supply.

The financial report was 
read and approved.

The following am end­
ments to the by-laws have 
been presented and will be 
voted on at the next meeting.

Amendment 1-The Board 
of Directors will consist of 
nine members. Three mem­
bers of the board shall be 
appointed annually to serve a 
term of three years. If three 
consecutive meetings are 
missed, without due cause, a 
new member shall be ap­
pointed to fill the vacancy.

After a routine check of the 
kitchen, it was decided that 
the counter tops would need 
attention in the near future.

DUPUCATE BRIDGE
In Duplicate Bridge Club 

play Saturday at the Ozona 
Country Club, Mrs. Gene 
Williams and Mrs. Clay Ad­
ams won the top spot and 
Jean North and Evart White 
were second.

Winners in play Sunday 
were Mrs. Adams and Mrs. 
Joe Clayton, high, and Mrs. 
Evart White and Mrs. Sid­
ney Millspaugh, second.

A T IP
f r o m

. . ^ A N T A ,

Wrangler Jeans
Reg, and Slim 

Boot Jean and Cowboy Cut
$2 099

Dec. 16-19
Wrangler Denim Jackets
Pile or Saddle Blanket Lined 

with Corduroy Collar

2 0  %  Off
Good selection of Gift Items
Hand crafted vases ̂ Musical items,

Indian Sand Paintings, Jewelry boxes

and more 2 0  % o f f  

Ladies Western Suits
By Pioneer Wear

2 5  %  Off
Come in and have punch and cookies with us 

and visit with Santa Claus, Saturday, Dec. 17tK 
from 1 to 4 and see our Circle Bar Race Car,
The Eagle now on display in the Retail Store.

l ^ r H . i . v  UiR ^  392-2637

It’s beginning to look a lot 
like Christmas! Everywhere 
there are wreaths, lights, 
candles, stockings, orna­
ments and trees. Christmas 
in America wasn’t always 
like it is today, rather it 
comes mainly fix)m Dutch, 
English and German tradi­
tions.

Three hundred years ago 
Dutch settlers celebrated 
Saint Nicholas on December 
5. The legend of Saint Nic­
holas has it that he was very 
wealthy and generous and 
secretly gave his money 
away to those in need. The 
children did not use stock­
ings, but rather placed their 
wooden shoes by the fire­
place. Saint Nicholas filled 
shoes of deserving kids with 
gifts and sweets, while mis­
behaved children received a 
birch rod. Before it got dark 
on the Eve of December 5, 
children filled their shoes 
with hay and carrots for Saint 
Nicholas and his white horse.

Two hundred years ago, 
the English tradition was to 
deck the house with boughs 
of evergreen holly and ivy 
symbolic of Christmas joy 
since their leaves remained 
green all winter. Christmas 
Eve began their festive cel­
ebrations which lasted 
throughout the twelve days 
of Christmas until January 6. 
Mistletoe traditions dictated 
that a kiss be given for every 
pearly berry plucked from 
the mistletoe.

One hundred years ago, 
greenery decked the inside 
and outside of homes....ev­
ergreen wreaths on the front 
door and garlands of holly 
and ivy on tables, mantles, 
doorways. On Christmas Eve 
children hung stockings by 
the fireplace in hope that 
Santa Claus would fill them 
with goodies. German tradi­
tion had it when the chil­
dren awoke on Christmas 
morning that their stockings 
were filled with gifts and the 
tree was beautifully decorat- 
ed and held many tiny can-

dles. Handmade ornaments, 
small sweet cookies cut in 
animal shapes and strings of 
popcorn and cranberries also 
decorated the evergreen 
tree.

What will your Christmas 
tradition be like this year? 
Artificial trees and blinking 
lights are plentiful, but you 
may have or want to try some 
of the traditions of early 
Christmases.

I would like to thank all the 
leaders, 4-H members, par­
ents, and businesses who 
helped make Saturday’s 
Food Show a great success. 
All of the contestants com­
peting Saturday were win­
ners and the judges certain­
ly had a tough job selecting 
the top award winners.

Wednesday's Only

Hamburger
Thursday's Only

Lionburger

$400 te
Friday's Only

Catfish Basket 

9 Pc. Bucket of Fish
$430

12 Pc. Bucket of Fish
$C00

1002 Sheffield Rd. Doiry King
392-3161

W E L C O M E

Scriptures by
The American Bible Society

Wonder what it’s like down there? Then go on down. 
Why do you hesitate? You’re being welcomed with love 
and warmth. The beautiful spirit of God beckons you. A 
wonderful experience awaits you.

Meed a miracle today? What better place to find it 
than in the House of God. Inside you will feel the love and 
joy of being in the presence of the Lord. Sit down and 
relax; with poise, confidence and happiness at having 
made the decision yourself. Listen to the minister and 
give thought to his words and their meaning. Join in the 
singing and be glad. Shed your tensions. Meet your 
neighbors and make new friends.

Lonely? Unhappy? Fearful? You needn’t be. The 
doors are open to you. Step in and create a miracle for 
yourself.

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday
Proverbs John John John Matthew Luke Isaiah

1:1-19 6:25-59 10:7-21 11:17-27 27:1-13 19:11-27 11:1-9

Copyright 1983 Keister Advertising Service and Williams Newspaper Features Syndicate P. O. Box 8024, Charlottesville, VA 22906 J
This series of ads is being published and sponsored by the Ozona 

business firms in the interest of a stronger community.

L’B Motor Co., Inc. 
Ozona National Bank 
Ozona Butane Co. 
Jim's Foodway

Brown Furniture 
Ozona TV System 
South Texas Lmbr. Co 
White's Auto

Crockett County National Bank
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4-H Food Show Winners-----

SENIOR main dish, Tonya Carter, first, 
Kim Baker, third, Norma Vasqoez,

SENIOR SNACKS-Snsan Scott, first; 
Mary Lon Hayes, second.

JUNIOR SNACKS-Jolie Carson, third; 
Jason Montgomery, first; Tamie Rea*

JUNIOR FRUITS*Sabrina Easterwood, 
third; Robin Myers, first; Tamel West, 
second.

JUNIOR BREADS-Terrie Wiilmon, 
first; Carri Chandler, third; Haley 
Carson, second.

BEGINNERS*Jessica Deaton, Bonnie 
Martin, Amy Easterwood, Jennifer 
Jones, Heather Kemp, Leesa Halre, 
Whitney Vannoy.

KATHY WEANT

Have made bridal 
selection 

in housewares 
at

SA V E  80%
O N  HEATING  

COSTS!

WITH THE E Z 
FIREPLACE INSERT

Hundreds of cuslomers ac­
tually report saving 100% 
simply by turning off other 
sources of heat and burn­
ing their E-Z Insert. You 
con too. See our E-Z 
display. Get our com­
parison check list. It will 
help you choose your in­
sert. Available now ex­
c lu s iv e ly  at:

{R ep lace  
P L U S
PHONE 944-9180

Built-in Fireplaces 
Freestanding Fireplaces 
Thermorite Glass Doors 

Accessories - Ceiling Fans
SALES. SERV ICE  & INSTALLATION  

110 WESTLAND 
SAN ANGELO. TEXAS 76901

V
W E L C O M E

* "  *  *  *

BIG *  
OPEN 
HOUSE
w it h

Doris Richards ^
Daroiyn Moore ^

Eiectric Living Consuitants

41̂  Free Holiday Treats

^  Christmas Decorations Display

^  Free “Holiday Delights”
Recipe Book

Thursday, December 15th, 1983 

10:00 o.m.-3:00 p.m.

WEST TEXAS UnUTIES COMPANY ^ i

An F.qiiel 
Opporturwiy 
Employfr

A Miwibw ol The Central and South West System

JUNIOR main dish, Marandy Keith, 
second. Treble West, first, Mary Turn- 
ley, third

Phillips 
art group
paints Tues.

This fall the Charlotte B. 
Phillips Art Group has been 
painting all day on Tues­
days in the board room at the 
Chamber of Commerce. 
Members of the group in­
clude Louisa Pearson, Beth 
Marks, Mary Jo Mason, 
Ruth Dorris, Polly Perner, 
Joyce Maness, Jonnie John­
son, Katie Jones and Joan 
Nicholas.

The group recently spon­
sored a three-day oil paint­
ing workshop with J.D. Keel, 
Jr., of Seagraves as instruc­
tor. Also a one-day work­
shop in oils was instructed by 
Mary Jo Mason.

The group will reconvene 
after the holidays, Tuesday, 
Jan. 3, at 9 a.m. Anyone 
wishing to come or seeking 
information may contact 
Joan Nicholas. Water color 
and oil painting enthusiasts 
are welcome. Also, Mrs. 
Mason will instruct a work­
shop in water color, date to 
be announced. Contact Mrs. 
Nicholas for details.

Memorials for the Char­
lotte B. Phillips Art Schol­
arship fund may be mailed to 
Box 1007, Ozona.

" It 's  Fan Tyme—
Get Ready For Winter'

O ur Fans Moke G REA T Christm as G ifts 
A t Prices You Can A fford!

The Popular
HUGGER WHILE

N O W  S U P P I T
52 'ta n  sgg.. LASTS

•Reversible for winter 
•Pull chain 3 Speed 
•Quiet sealed ball bearing motor \ 
•UL approved 
•Lifetime warranty

A n t iq u e  o r  
P o l is h e d  B r a s s #

52" DELUXE FAN
$ 3 0 9 9

EETIRE STOCK ON S U E  NOW

*Price«lso 
good at our

MfOOd \  
Location. ^  

IE .  West Austin 
IMIWOOd. Tx.

Fan TYNE
, ^ —j2220 Sherwood Way 
 ̂ y  San Angelo, Tx. 

V T  944^292
HOURS: 10a.m.-5p.m. Mon. Thru Sat.

Circle Bar Truck 
Corral

FEATURING STEAKS & SEAFOOD

WE WANT YOUR BUSINESS
HAVE YOUR CHRISTMAS P A R T I E S  A T  THE CIRCLE BAR

cLostD Dining Room
WID. THRU SAT.

MOH.ANDTUSS. 5 p £ ( ; | A L 5  S p .m .- i O p .m .

Imported Cheeses With Salad Bar 

Wednesday SIRLOIN FOR TWO

FrUay UB. NEW YORK STRIP

n iM lR IB A N D  
SHRIMP SCAMPI COMBO

11 a.m.-2 p.m.
Sunday

STCAMBOA T BOUND ROAST 

TURKEY AND DRESSING 

POPCORN SHRIMP $ Z  95
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f i f l S K f T d f l l l  P M V I f W  ' ’ M
Ozona High School

r

Weekly Pick' em Sheet
Kek thf Winner

$20*00 Jockpot
□  BUFFALO AT
□  DENVER AT
□  GREEN BAY AT
□  CINCINNATI AT
□  L.A. RAMS AT
□  NEW ENGLAND AT
□  PITTSBURG AT
□  SAN DIEGO AT
□  NEW YORK GIANTS AT

ATLANTA □  
KANSAS CITY °  
CHICAGO D 
MINNESOTA ^  
NEW ORLEANS °  
SEATTLE □  
CLEVELAND °  
L.A. RAIDERS ^  
WASHINGTON <=>

TIE BREAKER-PICK A SCORE

-New Y<mA Jets st Miami-—

Send FootbaU Omtest Tot 
OZONA STOCKMAN 

BOX 370
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

t
Deadline for contest ta Friday

NAME-
ADDRESS—  

PHONE NO.-

OHS Basketball Schedule 1983-84
D A T E  O P P O N E N T

NOV. 10 Ft. Stockton (Scrinmago)
18 Ft. Stockton (Scrimmagn)
18 Iraan (Scrimmage)
22 Rankin
28 Ft. Stockton
29 Eldorado 
'1

DEC.
1.2.3 Crane Tournament
1.2.3 Sonora Tournament
2,3 Ft. Stockton Tournament

5 Sonora
6 Junction

8,9,10 Ozona Tournament
12 NcCamey
13 Iraan
U  Hanliin
IS Big Lake 
IS licCamey

JAN. 3 BALLINGER 
3 Junction
5 Sonora

5.6.7 Reagan County Tournament
5.6.7 Eldorado Tournament 

9 Ft. Stockton
10 SONORA
12 Crane
13 COAHOMA 
17 CRANE
20 COLORADO CITY

19,21 Eldorado Tournament
23 Ft. Stockton
24 Iraan
27 BALLINGER
30 Big Lake
31 SONORA

FEB. 2 McCamey > v .
3 COAHOMA'
6 Ft. Stockton
7 CRANE 
9 Crane
10 COLORADO CITY
14 SONORA
17 BALLINGER

PLACE

Ft. Stockton 
Ft. Stockton 
Iraan 
Ozona
Ft. Stockton 
Eldorado

Crane
Sonora
Ft. Stockton
Ozona
Junction
Ozona
McCamey
Ozona
K a liil t  1 I,
Big Lake 
McCamey
Bal1i nger
Ozona
Sonora
Big Lake
Eldorado
Ft. Stockton
Ozona
Crane
Ozona
Crane
Colorado City
Eldorado
Ozona
Iraan
Ozona
Ozona
Sonora
Ozona
Coahoma
Ft. Stockton
Ozona
Ozona
Ozona
Ozona
Ballinger

TIME BOYS (5IRLH

4 :3 0  
4 :3 0  
4 :3 0  
5 :0 0  
5 :3 0  
4 :0 0

5 :3 0
4 :0 0

5 :3 0  
6: IS
4:30
5 :0 0

6 :1 5  
6 ; 15 
5 :0 0

5 :3 0  
6 :1 5  
6 :0 0  
5 :0 0  
5 :0 0  
5 :0 0

5 :3 0
6 :3 0
5 :0 0
5 :3 0
5 :0 0

5 :3 0  
5 :0 0  
5 :3 0  
5 : o o  
6 :0 0  
5 :0 0  
6: IS 
6 :1 5

A6B
A&B
9
AScB

9
9
AScB
A
9
Al.tl
9
A6B

A6B
9
A

9
A6B
A&B
ASiB
B
9
A6B
A S tB
9
MtB

9
AScB
9
AScB
9
AScB
AScB
AScB

AScBSc9
AScB
AScB
AScB

AScB

AScB
A
9
AlcB

9
AScB
AScB

AScB
9
AScB
AScB
AScB
B

AScB
9
AScB
9
AScB
AScB
9
AScB

UPPER CASE denotes District 6-AAA games
Head Boys Coach 
John Curry 
Ozona High School

Head Girls Coach 
Terri McColloch

Sponsored By These Ozona Businesses:

MANtSS TfXACO STATIONS U U r  CONSTRUCTION CERVANTiZ EXXON THE LINE

SONNT'S D R IV i-m  GRO. BROWN FURNITURE CO. OZONA T-V SYSTEM OJB, INC.

FIRST SAVINGS H O A R TITi BISHOP WELDING MAXINE'S FLOWERS 1-10 EXXON

FOXWORTH-GAIBRAITH , OZONA STEAK HOUSE JIM'S POODWAY FESCO, INC

OZONA NATIONAl BANK PEPE'S RESTAURANT NICKS CHEVRON CAMERAS II

OZONA INN OF THi WIST CHARUE'SMSMCAFE WOOL GROWERS HORSE'S INN

ttCHATO'SRiSTAURANT MONTGOMERY WARD BAGGETT AGENCY FIERROSHELL

OAYTON'S VIUAGFDRUG THORP'S LAUN-DRY DINA'S POCO TACO DAIRY KING

JATIRIUtR CONSTRUCTION OZONA QUICK STOP BSC AUTOMOTIVE MAGICLAHD

SOUTH TEXAS lUMBtR CO. WESTERMAH DRUG SMALL FASHIONS L-B MOTOR CO.

CIRCU BAR TRUCK CORRAL ELMA'SROADSIDEGRO. WATSON'S DEP MOORE OIL CO.
THORNTON'S SUFIRMARKET DaLaROSA PLUMBING KYLEKLEANERS OZONA BUTANE
CROCKETT CO.WATFR DOT. VFW POST 6109 WHITE HOUSE CO. HAPPYHOLLOW

U IZABSm  UPHAM INS.AGENCY CROCKETTCO.NATIONAL BANK
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Firearms are deadly 
prevent accidents

THE OZONA STOCKMAN PAGE SEVEN $

Firearms are deadly wea­
pons, deadly enough to kill 
19 Texas hunters in 1981 and 
23 in 1982.

Texas hunting accidents 
also result in up to 100 
non-fatal disabling injuries 
each year.

“ With increased fall and 
winter hunting activities at 
hand, it’s appropriate to 
recall the basic rules of hunt­
er safety,” reminds Dr. Gary 
S. Nelson, safety engineer 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Nelson points out that 
although basic hunter safety 
rules may seem elementary 
and a matter of common 
sense, the occasional viola­
tion of these simple rules by 
otherwise safe hunters re­
sults in both fatalities and 
injuries.

He lists these basic fire­
arm safety rules:

Treat every gun with the 
respect due a loaded gun, 
even if you “ know” it’s not 
loaded.

Guns carried into a camp 
or home, or put into auto­
mobiles, must always be un­
loaded.

Always be sure that the 
barrel and action are clear of 
obstructions before loading.

Always carry your gun so 
that you can control the 
direction of the muzzle, even 
if you stumble. Keep the 
“ safety” on until you are 
ready to shoot.

Always be sure of your 
target and your background 
before putting your finger on

OZONA 
CHURCH OF 

CHRIST
110211th Owma

Sunday Morning Gass 
9:45

Sunday Morning Worship 
• 10:50

Sunday Evening Worship 
6:30

Wednesday Evening 
Gass 
7:00

RA^HA I^ERSO N

Serving .Qirlst By 
Serving Yon

the trigger.
Never point a gun at 

anything you do not intend to 
shoot.

Unattended or stored guns 
should always be unloaded; 
guns and ammunition should 
be stored safely beyond 
reach of children and care­
less adults.

Never climb a tree or fence 
with a loaded gun.

Never shoot at a flat, hard 
surface or the surface of 
water.

Never mix gunpowder with 
alcohol.

“ Safety costs nothing 
while carelessness can lead 
to devastating results,” em­
phasizes Nelson. “ So prac­
tice safety every day.”

Mrs. Couch 
is bridge 
hostess

Mrs. Joe Couch was hos­
tess for the annual Christ­
mas luncheon and bridge at 
the Ozona Country Club 
Thursday.

Mrs. Clay Adams, long­
time chairman for the club, 
was presented with a large 
poinsettia, as members se­
lected gifts from the tree.

High score went to Mrs. 
C.O. Walker and second high 
to Mrs. Adams. Mrs. Sher­
man Taylor won the club 
bingo and Mrs. Charles Wil­
liams won the Charlotte Phil­
lips bingo.

Others playing were 
Mmes. Sonny Bailey, Joe 
Bean, James Childress, John 
Childress, Hugh Childress, 
John R. Hunnicutt, Arthur 
Kyle, George Bunger, Doug­
las Moore, Kirby Moore, 
Jack Williams, Byron Wil­
liams, Gene Perry, B. W. 
Stuart, Buddy Phillips, Evart 
White, Billy Carson, Jake 
Short, Joe Clayton, Beecher 
i'l'Iontgomery, Gene Williams 
and J. T. Dockery.

Luncheon guests included 
Mrs. W. H. Bunger, Mrs. 
Robert Cox and Mrs. Rufus 
Ward. Mrs. Joe Bean will be 
hostess Dec. 15.

Crockett County 

Care Center News

BY ANN McCa rtn ey  
DIRECTOR OF ACTIVITIES & SOCIAL CARE

warn

PHONE NEWS TO THE 
STOCKMAN.

thy Wells, Jeannie Davis, 
Diana Ramos, Dee Marie 
Ramos, Sabra Solomon and 
Ryan Davis.

Dominoes were played se­
veral times this week by 
Maude Pettit, Paul Cavin, 
Ola Mills and Johnny Hen­
derson.

Thursday morning’s beau­
ty shop was manned by Lola 
Rios, Eglantino Estrado and 
Betty Bullard. In the after­
noon, Charles Huffman and 
four members of his church 
came for Bible study.

Thursday night our resi­
dents once again had a real 
treat when the Beaird Band 
from Big Lake came for a real 
dance. Staff and volunteers 
waltzed the following resi­
dents around: Carol Reed, 
Paul Cavin, Frances Borre­
go, Tomasa Ramos, Maggie 
Crawford, Virginia Russell, 
Alice Ross, Nila Turnell, 
Maude Pettit, Billie What­
ley and Moriama Perez. 
Thanks goes to Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Beaird, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Beaird and Bill Dane.

On Friday the gifts 
brought on Wednesday were 
wrapped by Woman’s Forum 
members, Louise Bunger 
and Betty Perry. Three other 
members brought wrapped 
boxes.

A large group of Catholic 
youth came on Sunday for 
our afternoon chruch servic­
es. They gave their usual fine 
program.

Come to our Christmas 
party this Thursday.

7th grade 
Cubettes 
get win
The Seventh Grade Cub­

ettes defeated McCamey 
the First Baptist Church of Monday night, December 12, 
Big Lake. The residents were in Ozona. 
treated to eight gifts each to The Cubettes played an 
have to give to their fami- excellent game both offen- 
lies. Joyce Rowland was this sively and defensively, stat- 
year’s chairman, J a n  Solo- ed Coach Sessom. McCamey 
mon brought us a song showed up Monday night 
service. They were assisted ready to give Ozona a good 
by Josphine Longoria, Doro- ballgame and they did but

the Cubettes were ready for 
them and won the game 
27-13.

Scoring points for the Cub­
ettes were Staci Lay, 10 
points; Cathy Moran, 5 po­
ints; Dottie Gonzales, Patty 
Sanchez, Shannon Curry, 
Polly Villarreal, Katy Camer­
on and Maria Sanchez, 2 
points each. Patty Sanchez 
played an excellent defensive 
game with 8 steals and 5 
rebounds. Patty Garcia came 
off the bench and helped out 
with 4 rebounds and good 
hustle. All the girls got to 
play and they all either 
scored or helped out with 
rebounds or steals.

Other team members are 
Serena Bodell, Idalia Fierro, 
Staci Winkley, Kristina Mar­
tinez, and Maribel Limon. 
Team managers are Terei 
Seaborn and Judy Fierro.

The Cubette’s next game 
will be at Crane Monday, 
December 19.

It is beginning to look a lot 
like Christmas, all around 
our home! We have up our 
stuffed Christmas decora­
tions now, as well as our 
Christmas tree and our ad­
vent tree. Thanks goes to 
Maude Couch, Blanche Wal­
ker and Mary Leigh Jones for 
assisting with the stuffed 
decorations.

Ceramic class was once 
again led by Doris Karr. 
Julie Watson assisted with 
the cleaning on new pieces 
for next week.

A Christmas fruit cake was 
made by the residents and 
will be served at our Christ­
mas party this Thursday 
night, Dec. 15. The party 
starts at 6:30 and will be the 
time for Santa Claus, the 
opening of gifts by our 
residents and then entertain­
ment furnished by the Knox 
Band. We hope all our rela­
tives and friends will come 
and share this joyous occa­
sion.

Thanks goes to Jo David­
son and Myrtle Post for 
furnishing the ingredients 
for the cake, to Massie West 
for money for our curtain 
fund, and to Anna Bell 
Patrick for Avon and for a 
memorial donation. We also 
received a nice memorial 
donation from South Texas 
Lumber.

Tomasa Ramos won the 
gift certificate from the Tea­
cher Store at bingo Friday. 
Moriama Perez won the sec­
ond place gift of stamped 
Christmas cards. Maude Pet­
tit was the winner of the El 
Chato dinner for two on 
Tuesday. Volunteers were 
Mollie Lumberas, Elodia Za­
pata, Anna Yruegas, Anna 
Bell Patrick, Dorothy Doll 
and Virginia Bishop.

Wednesday morning our 
residents were treated to 
their annual shopping spree 
by the W.M.U. ladies from

2 0  %  OFF

i  All Winter
Coats

Small 
Fashions

1004Ave. E  
392-3226

New care labeling law 
goes into effect

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Wil­
son, Jr., recently returned 
from Lufkin, where they at­
tended funeral services for 
Mr. Wilson’s father, W.J. 
Wilson.

Clothes shoppers can look 
for a little extra help from the 
government during 1984.

Amendments to the 1972 
Federal Trade Commission 
care label rule, set to go into 
effect Jan. 1, should assist 
consumers in clothing selec­
tion and care, says a Texas 
A&M University Agricultural 
Extension Service clothing 
specialist.

“The amendments seek to 
restore consumer confidence 
in care labels,” says Alma 
Fonseca who is with the 
Extension home economics 
program.

“The 1972 rule requiring 
manufacturers to put care 
labels in garments was a step 
in the right direction,” she 
says, “but it didn’t clearly 
spell out what information 
the labels should contain.”

Consumers have complain­
ed that some labels don’t 
give enough information to 
judge the requirements for 
ordinary use and upkeep of 
clothing, she says. For ex­
ample, a label might clearly 
state washing instructions 
but omit drying or ironing 
instructions when they are 
required for normal use of 
the item.

The lack of standardized 
terms on labels has created 
confusion among consumers 
as to the meaning of care 
instructions, explains Fonse­
ca.

Also, some manufacturers 
have simply placed inaccur­
ate care labels on garments, 
she adds.

The amendments are de­
signed to correct these prob­
lems and allow for better 
enforcement of the care label 
rule.

According to Fonseca, all 
manufacturers and importers 
of textile wearing apparel, 
except shoes, gloves and 
hats are covered by the 
amended rule.

Beginning in 1984, each 
label must provide either a 
washing or a drycleaning 
instruction which meets the 
requirements of the amend­
ment. In general, more de­
tailed information about 
washing and drying temper­
atures, ironing and the use of 
bleach will be required on 
the care labels.

“ The most important point 
in the amendment is that the 
information on care labels 
must be known to be relia­
ble before it is used,” says 
Fonseca. If challenged, the 
manufacturer must docu­
ment the reliability of care 
instructions with evidence 
from tests simulating ordi­
nary care, current technical 
literature and past experi­
ence.

A glossary of standard 
terms has also been provided 
for the manufacturers use, 
she notes. Manufacturers are 
encouraged, but not required 
to use these terms on their 
labels and tags or in liter­
ature for consumers.

The care labels must be 
attached to the garments in 
such a way that they can be 
easily found by customers. 
However, if manufacturers 
package on item so that the 
label is not visible, they can 
display the care instructions 
on the outside of the pack­
age, says the specialist.

There is one important 
exemption to the care label 
rule, Fonseca says. Gothes 
which can be cleaned safely 
under the harshest washing 
and drycleaning procedures- 
washing in hot water, dr3ring 
at a high setting, ironing at a

Does your 
life insurance fit together?
Over a lifetime, most of us acquire more 
than orte life insurance policy which may 
have gaps or riverl.ips when providing 
for your total needs.

This is expensive and may not meet all 
eventualities.

Your Farmers Agent has a portfolio of 
unique life insurance and annuity combi­
nations which ran Ire us»-d to nrrxfify or 
consolidate your existing program.

To quote just four examples:

MORTGAGE PROTECTOR 
A  new plan tailored to pay off the home 
mortgage even with today's high mortgage 
interest rates, if the breadwinner dies.

VIP 100
Permanent insurance at term-like rates, 
provkiing flexibility to meet almost every 
household or business life insurance ne^.

VARIABLE PREMIUM W HOLE LIFE 
A  modem approach to whole life irtsur- 
ance which provides the insured with 
the lowest possible rates.

PLAN FOR FINANCIAL INDEPENDENCE 
A  unique life insuratKe-annuity combina- 
lion package which provides for both work­
ing and retirement years. Ideal for IRA,

These programs and much more are 
available to you. ..why not give your 
Agent a call?

- ■ ' « l i

E l i z a b e t h  U p h a m
Ozona, Texas 76943

1012AVC.E 
Phone-392-2883 

Farmers New World Life Insurance Company

hot setting, bleaching and 
drycleaning with all commer­
cially available products-do 
not have to carry a care label 
in the garment. But the man­
ufacturer must place the 
statement “ wash or dry 
clean, any normal method” 
on the hang tag or package.

South Texas Lumber Co.
Will be open till

9:00 p.m.
Thursday, Dec. 22

. B A R B i n i E
ft fp O  f f 1

spb M
, / / ,  p P / / P )

WEST TEXAS BARBECUE
Every Friday

Begin serving at 6:00 p.m.

Ail the trimmings and all you can eat
Children under 12 price.

*4.95
OZONA STEAK HOUSE

OZONA INN OF THE WEST

Christmas I !

Wishes
Jorry Loy of L-B AAotor Co. w ishe s you o hoppy  

holiday season. To m ake  the se a so n  even  m ore  

cheerful, he w ants to g ive  you a five m inute  ^  

^  shopp ing  sp ree  at Thornton  s Superm arket  |  

or Jim 's Foodw ay  w hen you com e in and  buy a 

new  p ickup  or car. You will get to load up a 
w hee lbarrow  yourself with all the food you  
can put in the barrow  in 5 m inutes, exclud ing

meat, dairy products, tobacco and  drugs.

Com e in betw een  now  and  D ecem ber 30

p urchase  a ne w  Chevrolet, Cadillac, Buick, 

O ldsm obile, or Pontiac and  the shopp ing  

sp ree  is yours, a gift from L-B M oto r Co.

N o  dealer in W est Texas can undersell 

Jerry on a com parab le  car or pickup.

Jerry Lay w ishe s you a very merry, happy  

holiday season.

L-B MOTORS



PAGE EIGHT THE OZONA STOCKMAN WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 14, 1983 WEDN

Plans near completion
for horse symposium

STERLING LAY MEMORIAL sports­
manship award goes to David Vargas of 
Ozona and LaWonza Mitchell of Crane, 
in the recently completed 53rd Annual 
OHS Basketball Tournament.

[OHS photo]

Leasing vs. buying in
ranch equipment

When a farmer or rancher 
needs new equipment or ma­
chinery, is leasing or buying 
the best option?

Dr. Ashley Lovell of Ste­
phen ville, economist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service has analyzed these 
options for some alternative 
data obtained from several 
farm equipment dealers.

Total net cash flow after 
taxes indicated a negligible 
difference between leasing 
or buying, Lovell says. How­
ever, after annual net cash 
flows were converted or dis­
counted to present dollar 
values, buying was estima­
ted to be $383 less expen­
sive than leasing for one set 
of data which was analyzed.

“ However, one should not 
mistakenly conclude that 
buying is always less expen­
sive than leasing,” Lovell 
cautions. “ Different assump­
tions about discount rates 
and income tax factors can 
significantly affect costs of 
the options.”

Results of an analysis sev­
eral years ago by Dr. John 
Hopkin, professor of agricul­
tural economics at Texas 
A«feM University, indicated 
that the cash purchase choice 
was best at a low oppor­
tunity cost of capital, says 
Lovell. Hopkin also found

that credit purchases were 
optimum over medium dis­
count ranges and leasing was 
the most profitable method 
at high opportunity rates of 
return.

Lovell’s study reveals that 
cost differences between var­
ious dealers representing 
various brands of equipment 
ranged as widely as differ­
ences between buying and 
leasing.

“ In the 1980s, many pro­
ducers may decide that leas­
ing rather than traditional 
owning of equipment is the 
best alternative,” says Lov­
ell. “They need to identify 
advantages and shortcom­
ings of financial leases. Just 
as in financing equipment 
purchases, read and study 
the lease contract. Seek com­
petent farm management, 
legal and tax advice before 
trying something new,” he 
advises.

Plans for the Third Annual 
West Texas Horse Sympos­
ium and Trade Show are near 
completion according to Ec­
tor County Agricultural Ex­
tension Agent, Jim Mazur- 
kiewicz. The Symposium is 
set for December 17 in the 
Ector County Coliseum in 
Odessa.

Registration for the one 
day event featuring man­
agement talks and exhibits 
vital to the horse industry, 
will run from 8:00 a.m. to 
9:00 a.m. Following registra­
tion a brief introduction of 
the day’s speakers and 
guests will be given follow­
ed by the morning session.

“ Stallion Management” 
presented by Dr. B. W. 
Pickett, D.V.M. will be the 
first topic on tap. Pickett is 
director of the Equine Sci­
ences program at Colorado 
State University, Fort Col­
lins, Colorado. A native of 
Oklahoma, Pickett was ed­
ucated in Oklahoma and 
Missouri. He was with the 
University of Oklahoma for 
10 years prior to moving to 
Colorado where he has been 
for 17 years.

The first of two thirty 
minute breaks will follow Dr. 
Pickett. The two breaks are 
scheduled so that partici­
pants may have the chance to 
visit the booths and dis­
plays set up on the grounds 
by companies and individ­
uals participating in the 
trade show segment of the 
program.

Richard Shrake, a profes­
sional horse trainer from 
Oregon City, Oregon is set to 
complete the morning ses­
sion with presentations on 
bits and the bitting of horses 
and correct horsemanship for 
all show classes. Shrake, 
holds a degree from Oregon 
State University. A top 
horsemanship coach, his stu­
dents have won more than 40 
American Junior Quarter 
Horse Association Top Ten 
Awards.

Lunch will be served on 
the premises from noon to 
1:00 p.m. The afternoon 
session will begin with a dual 
topic talk set to be deliv­
ered by Dr. Don R. Mc­
Donald, D.V.M. He will 
speak on the use of ultra­
sound therapy and Equine

Itemized bill required

for Medicare payment

CORRECTION
In listing the all tourna­

ment team for last year, the 
Ozona player making the 
team was not Zeke Sanchez 
but Zeke Martinez. The re­
sults we were given listed 
Sanchez.

Many people in the San 
Angelo area face a longer 
than necessary wait to re­
ceive payment under the 
Medicare medical insurance 
program because they fail to 
submit an itemized bill with 
their request for payment 
form, Frank Upp, Social Se­
curity District Manager in 
San Angelo, said recently.

Medical insurance is that 
part of Medicare that helps 
pay for doctor bills, out­
patient hospital bills, and 
other items and services not 
covered by Medicare hospi­
tal insurance.

To receive payment under 
medical insurance, a person 
generally must submit a 
request for payment form. 
The doctor or other supplier 
completes part of the form or 
provides an itemized bill to 
send with the form.

The problem arises, Upp

said, when the bill does not 
provide a detailed descrip­
tion of the services provid­
ed; and, therefore, a deci­
sion cannot be made as to 
whether they are covered. As 
a result, the patient must be 
contacted for more informa­
tion and payment is delayed.

reproduction. Dr. McDonald 
is a large-animal practition­
er based at Sterling City. He 
received his degree in Vet­
erinary medicine from Texas 
A&M University in 1966. He 
served an internship at the 
University of California be­
fore returning to the A&M 
faculty. He remained at 
A&M where he became head 
of the Equine Medicine sec­
tion. In 1978 McDonald left 
the faculty to pursue private 
practice. He currently has an 
equine practice near Ster­
ling City. He was honored in 
1983 as the Equine Practi­
tioner of the Year in Texas.

“ Sexual Behavior in 
Breeding Stallions” will be 
the final topic covered dur­
ing the afternoon session. 
Dr. Pickett is set to make the 
delivery.

Following a second break, 
a stallion parade narrated by 
Jimmy Taylor of Big Spring 
will show participants what 
the area has to offer in the 
way of breeding stock. The 
day will conclude with a 
social hour and trade show 
visit followed by a barbecue 
set for 6:00 p.m. A repre­
sentative from the American 
Quarter Horse Association is 
set to be the evenings key­
note speaker.

For further information 
contact: West Texas Horse 
Symposium, % Jim and An­
gie Gourley, 3915 Brazos, 
Odessa, Texas 79764, 915- 
381-2345 or call Jim Maz- 
urkiewicz 915-332-6262.

4-H Food-

[Continued From Page IJ
To prevent this delay, the 

person should be sure that 
each bill shows: a descrip­
tion of each service provided; 
the date the service was 
provided; the place the ser­
vice was provided; the 
charge for each service pro­
vided; the doctor or supp­
lier who provided the ser­
vice; and the person’s name 
and health insurance num­
ber, exactly as they are 
shown on the Medicare card.

It is helpful if the diag­
nosis is also shown, Upp 
said.

of 4-H project groups were 
Kim Baker, Sally Borrego, 
Crystelle Childress, Marina 
Garza, Lou Haire, Lou Anna 
Haire, Mary Louise Hayes, 
Karen Huffman, Evelyn 
Keith, Betty King, Betty 
Martin, Debora Mayfield, 
Daniel Payne, Diane Puckett, 
Cynthia Ramos, Jacquelyn 
Shacklette, Susan Scott, Dot- 
tie Searcy, Julie Reagor, 
Vickie Reagor, Jeanie 
Thompson, Sharman West, 
Pat Willmon and Joyce 
Young.

It’S a 2-way radio! irs a radiophoner
IT’S A TIIVIE SAUER!

Motorola Privacy Plus multi-channel 
trunked radio keeps you and your 
workers in touch with these special 
features:

Privacy of an office phone.
Fast channel access.
Autom atic channel assignment. 
Confidential conversations with 
supervisors or specialized workers. 
Easy operation—push 
one button to talk.

Learn how Motorola Privacy Plus radio can  help 
you control your business and reduce costs.
Call our Information Center at: 
1-800-367-2346 Ext. 0607 San Angelo Rep.or fill out coupon. 915-653-1027 

after 6:00 915-465-8101
’Provides dispatch communications through telephone networks.

<SM O T O R O L A
Communications and Electronics Inc.

Interconnect 
with local 
phone system.*

0607
Barbara Bennett
Motorola Communications and Electronics Inc. 
1304 E. Algonquin Rood, Schaumburg. IL 60196

Name

Business

Address. 

C ity___ .Stote. 21P.

Phone.
Best time to call

HYDROGEN FUEL 
SEARCH TAKES STEP 
FORWARD AT A&M

The search for technology 
to make hydrogen fuel com­
mercially competitive with 
other fuels has taken another 
step forward at Texas A&M 
University with the awarding 
of a $150,000 grant from the , 
National Science Foundation.

The support will allow con­
tinuation of hydrogen fuel 
studies being conducted by 
researchers working under 
internationally acclaimed 
electrochemist Dr. John 
Bockris.

Under Bockris’ leadership, 
the reseachers are investi­
gating a method to efficient­
ly obtain hydrogen from or­
dinary water using solar 
power and a centuries-old 
technique called electrolysis 
to split water molecules.

CLASSIFIED ADS GET 
RESULTS.

WE MIIU) A SEU: M  bwAi 
fstat, pifa pasts. TIm 

tt*di at Ptpa ia tb* SwrtbwMt, UmI

DEER HUNTER VALUES
• GRILL GUARDS

• SEAT MOUNTS

• RIFLE RACKS

• P ia U P  BOXES

• DEER BLINDS

• DEER FEEDERS

• GAL. WELDED PANEU

Form and Ranch Division 
Higliwwy 90 East 

Uvflida, TX 71801

512-278-7111 - 1-800-443-6726

HAAowAnt STonts

TOOL VALUE
o r  T H E  M O N T H

iiAumvAKi:
VALIJi:

01' rili: MONTH
BARGAIN
OF THE MONTH

Master
MECHANIC <

W hlleSupplies Q99

19-In. Hip-Roof Toolbox
Sturdy steel construction 
with handy tote tray and 
socket divider. MM819 

Quantities Limited

JfuuĴ xiue-

While Supplies

Fan-Forced 
Electric Heater
Fan blows heat towards 
you. Automatic thermostat. 
Cool-touch case. HR10  

Quantities Limited

2V3-Qt.
Whistling
Teakettle

Solid-copper kettle quickly brings 
water to a boil then whistles 
Stay-cool handle 2901

Quantities Limited

South Texas Lumber Co.
JSOSAve.C. 392-2634

\
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lift ̂ uide
The

Cottage Collection
is full to the brim with

Gifts
Party Goods

Stocking Stuff ers 
Christmas

Tags and Wrappings 
Tree Trims

Wish list for Christmas

Come by and pu t your name 
on our Christmas gift list.

Cottage Collection
301-llth 392-3601
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Historic bridges merit 
preservation for future

GIFT ITEMS FROM THE MUSEUM- 
This display of items on sale at the 
maseum include **Amanda Goes 
West,”  a frontier p i ^ r  doll hook,

” Ozona Country,”  hy Allan Bosworth; 
the Crockett County History Book, and 
Yesteryear, hy Vic Pierce.

Insect fights insect in 
entomology project

Several species of tiny 
parasitic wasps will battle to 
the death in a Texas A&M 
University laboratory as part 
of an international project to 
find natural controls for a 
crop-destroying fly.

Texas A&M entomologist 
Dr. Brad Vinson heads the

study pitting the insects in a 
“ survival of the fittest” ex­
periment to determine which 
species can be used to kill 
millions of tiny “ dandruff­

like” tobacco white-flies that 
destroy crops both here and 
abroad.

BRIMM’S BAR-B-0
P&NDALE, TEXAS

The Capitol - of - Nowhere
(2 miles East of Pandale, Texas on Comstock Road)

•  Beer •  Ice •  Groceries •  Gas •

•  Hunting & Fishing Supplies •

•  Nachos •  Sandwiches •  Snacks •

•  Coffee •  Cold Drinks •  Etc. •

•  pr  esh Yard

•  Deer Storage •

Fof the Best Bar-B-Q - East or West of the Pecos 
Come See Us!!

CIUMM'S-

OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK 
8 AM TO 10 PM

YOU WILL ALWAYS GCT 
PROMPT SERVICE AND 

A VI-JtY BIG SMILE

YOU-ALL COME NOW!

om e Tims crimm

The three-year project, 
sponsored by a $200,000 
grant from the Binational 
Agricultural Research and 
Development Program in Tel 
Aviv, through the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Sta­
tion, depends on the techni­
que of integrated pest man­
agement in which wasps are 
used to control the flies that 
have proven resistant to 
chemical means, Vinson 
said.

Histamine
changes
reaction

Histamine, the natural 
compound most people asso­
ciate with setting off allergy 
symptoms, can alter the re­
action of drugs given to fight 
high blood pressure, says a 
Texas A&M University medi­
cal researcher.

Histamine is synthesized 
and released by nerves in the 
central nervous system, and 
can be found near cardio­
vascular “ control centers.” 
The substance causes large 
increases in blood pressure 
and interferes with medica­
tion for hypertension, ex­
plained pharmacologist Dr. 
Jerome Trzeciakowski.

STOCKMAN CLASSIFIED 
ADS GET RESULTS.

Americans have long been 
among the most prodigious 
and skilled bridge builders in 
the world. Magnificent struc­
tures such as the Brooklyn 
Bridge and the Golden Gate 
Bridge are universally rec­
ognized for their engineer­
ing daring and beauty. Less 
well-known are the dozens of 
stone, wood, iron, and con­
crete bridge designs invent­
ed by American engineers 
that, for the first time, made 
it economically possible to 
span rivers and gorges in 
more remote regions of the 
country. It is these more 
plebeian structures that 
formed the backbone of the 
American transportation sys­
tem. Their design and ma­
terials reveal much about the 
industrial, technological, and 
economical growth of the 
state and the nation.

Yet, bridges stand among 
the most endangered histori­
cal artifacts in our society. 
Because many of them still 
function as key elements in 
the present-day highway sys­
tem, their historical signi­
ficance is often overlooked. 
Recent efforts to modernize 
this system have placed ma­
ny historic bridges in grave 
danger of destruction.

Due to the rapid popu­
lation growth of Texas, many 
bridges originally construct­
ed in rural areas now are in 
the midst of urban sprawl or 
on routes with heavy traffic 
use. Some bridges will need 
to be replaced to serve in­
creased traffic loads. Many 
difficult decisions concern­
ing which bridges should be 
preserved and which de­
stroyed are forthcoming.

Historical significance 
sould be a main concern 
when determining the fate of 
a bridge. To evaluate the 
historic significance of a par­
ticular bridge, field inspec­
tions and archival research 
are conducted. If, upon eval­
uation, a bridge proposed for 
alteration or demolition is 
eligible for listing in the 
National Register of Historic 
Places, the State Historical 
Preservation Officer (in Tex­
as, the executive director of 
the Texas Historical Com­
mission), the Advisory Coun­

cil on Historic Preservation, 
and the Federal Highway 
Administration try to reach a 
Memorandum of Agreement 
about its future. Historic 
bridges subject to removal 
must undergo review to de­
termine that there is “ no 
feasible or prudent alter­
native.” Alternatives might

Datas II Computer
Reservations

♦  Tickets^

Boarding Passes 

4̂  Special Meals***

i|( in Minutes

♦  at

The Travelers III
403 Hwy 277 N 

Sonora, Texas 
387-2586

be:
Using the bridge for one­

way traffic and construct­
ing a new bridge to accept 
traffic in the opposite direc­
tion.

Leaving the old bridge in 
place and using it as a focal 
point for a roadside park, 
part of a hike and bike trail, 
or a fishing bridge.

Relocating or dismantling 
and storing it for future use.

The Texas Historical Com­
mission eventually hopes to 
evaluate all historic bridges 
in the state and thereby place

American

Justice
[Continued From Page 1]

site side. In a civil case the 
scale need only tip slightly in 
the direction of either side to 
decide the case for that 
party. However, in a criminal 
case, to convict the defen­
dant, the state’s side of the 
scale must be fully weighed 

'down with evidence.
There are around 5,300 

appeals fried with the Su­
preme Court each year. The 
court is actually able to 
review in detail only about 
200 cases per year.

About 12 million civil suits 
are brought annually to the 
U.S. Only 10 percent of these 
will actually be tried.

Which side wins most 
often when a civil suit is 
tried? Each side wins about 
half the time. When you 
think about it, this is as it 
should be. It indicates a 
balance in the way parties 
perceive the value of their 
cases, the way jurors and 
judges decide them, and the 
way the courts administrate 
them.

Each citizen bears a re­
sponsibility to the system of 
justice in America. Only 
through information, aware­
ness, and concern can the 
system be improved.

This article was provided 
by Bill Mason, your District 
Attorney, and Tom Cameron, 
your County Attorney.

them within a larger histor­
ical context. This evaluation 
will allow for the develop­
ment of a statewide plan that 
will set priorities based on

the relative signifrcance of 
each bridge in the state. Lo­
cal historical societies and 
commissions can have a posi­

tive influence on the pre­
servation of historic bridg­
es by gathering information 
on the bridges in their area.

The Colonel’s Pipe Shop
in San Angelo

\  Southwest Plaza

V  PIPES!
Accessories, Lighters 

Custom Blended Tobaccos 
Walk-in Cigar Humidor

Nat Sherman Premium Cigarettes 
Imported Cigarettes 

Phone 944-3322 Mail Order ServiceI

Let us help you express your sentiments at the holidays with the finest 
in chocolates and butter bons. Now in colorful, free gift wraps, oiir 
favorite assortments are available for all the people you wish to remem­
ber at this special time of year.

Assorted Chocolates 
(open box shown)
Chocolate Covered Nuts
Especially For You
Pecan Delights

1 lb., 2 lb., 3 lb. and 5 lb.

1 lb. and 2 lb.
2V4 lb.
1 lb.

916AvE

(shown clockwise)

Westerman Drug 392-2608

When was 
the last time 
your bank 

sent you 
something 

entertaining 
to read?

w  ’re all accustomed to 
receiving things like bank 
statements, new investment 
announcements, brochures 
explaining new financial services, 
etc., from our banks . . . 
important information but 
nothing that makes you want to 
rip open the envelope and start 
reading, right?

Wrong, at least for members of
ourBANCLUB.

If you're a member, you’ll 
receive a lively “Members Only’’ 
magazine twice a year. I t’s 
packed with interesting, 
informative, and understandable 
articles about real-life financial 
situations and how you can make 
your money work for you. Plus 
you’ll read about the latest 
special offerings ~  the weekend 
trips, tour packages and special 
discounts that are also available.

Your “Members Only’’ 
magazine is only one of the 
services of BANCLUB.

To become a member, just stop 
by or give us a call.

We make 
your money 
worth more.

BANKING HOURS 
8:00 a.in.-5:00 p.m.

Monday-Friday 
392-3745,392-5829

C R O C K E T T
CO U N TY

N A T IO N A L
BA N K

P.O. Bo* 1089 Ozona, Te*«» 76943

Member F.D.I.C.
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Taking Vitamin C to 

ward off colds

The Scientists Tell M e ...

Low Beef Prices Are Subsidized 
By W idespread Producer Losses

During winter many peo­
ple start taking vitamin C to 
ward off the common cold.

Vitamin C is necessary for 
every cell in the body. It 
prevents scurvy, which cau­
ses swollen and sore joints, 
spongy bleeding gums and 
bruising.

But just how much vitamin 
C is necessary for good 
health has been the subject 
of a 50-year controversy.

According to the National 
Research Council, which sets 
recommended levels for nu­
trients, 60 milligrams of vita­
min C per day is adequate to 
maintain good health. A 
single orange has about 66 
milligrams.

It takes only 15 milli­
grams of vitamin C per day to 
prevent scurvy.

“ Some self-taught nutri­
tionists and vitamin sales 
persons disagree with this 
figure,” says Dr. Alice Hunt, 
a Texas A«feM University 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice nutritionist.

“They believe that two-, 
four- ten- or 100-times more 
than the recommended daily 
amount will protect you from 
illness. But these claims 
have not been supported by 
scientific investigations,” 
she says.

For example, research

shows that the duration of 
cold symptoms could be re­
duced by only about 2‘/2 
hours by taking high doses of 
vitamin C, reports Hunt.

“Taking large doses of 
vitamin C poses little risk. 
But people should recognize 
that their bodies will become 
dependent on the vitamin, so 
they will have to gradually 
reduce the amount if they 
ever decide to stop taking 
it,” says the nutritionist.

It’s not necessary to take 
vitamin C in pill form, she 
says. The vitamin is availa­
ble from a variety of foods 
such as dark green leafy 
vegetables, citrus fruits and 
berries.

A stalk of broccoli has 100 
milligrams; a cup of chopped 
cabbage or coleslaw, rasp­
berries, a baked potato or a 
tomato each have about 30 
milligrams of vitamin C.

Since the tablets can be 
costly, consumers might also 
find food sources a more 
economical way to get their 
vitamin C, says Hunt.

Stockman  

classifieds 

get results

By-Robert L. Haney 
TAES Science Writer

“Today’s low prices for 
beef, while of short-term 
benefit to consumers, is no 
cause for celebration,” ac­
cording to Dr. Donald Farris, 
Professor of Livestock Mar­
keting at Texas A&M Uni­
versity.

“ Our current low beef 
prices are being heavily sub­
sidized by producer losses. 
Prolonged worldwide reces­
sion has combined with 
drought in major livestock 
producing areas of the world 
to increase feed costs and 
drive down market prices,” 
Farris said.

“The current problem of 
forced sales of cattle in the 
drought-stricken areas of the 
U.S., (the world’s largest 
beef producer), has been an 
even greater problem for 
over a year in Australia, (the 
world’s largest beef export­
er).

“ Drought in many parts of 
the world has temporarily 
increased supplies of meat in 
world markets, that were al­
ready depressed by world­
wide recession.

“ All this has come on the 
heels of the shock to the 
South American beef indus­
tries of Argentina, Uruguay, 
and Brazil by Western Eur­

opean trade policies that 
have taken away much of the 
traditional South American 
export markets in Western 
Europe.

“ Because most of the de­
veloped world-the main con­
sumers of red meat-have 
very restrictive import poli­
cies, their markets are not 
free to respond to these 
temporary increases in sup­
plies.

“Thus, bad weather, re­
cession, and adverse nation­
al and international policies 
have combined to deliver a 
severe financial blow to the 
world-wide livestock indus­
try.”

Livestock producers know 
they are in a high-risk bus­
iness and have always at­
tempted to spread their risk. 
Some do it by diversifying 
their farm or ranch enter­
prises; others by depending 
more on off-farm income, 
according to Farris.

There are also market me­
chanisms such as contracts, 
hedging on future markets 
and spreading marketings 
over a longer period, but 
these efforts to spread risk 
are often overwhelmed by 
prolonged periods of adverse 
weather and economic con­
ditions.

U.S. consumers have ben­
efited by having lower red

meat prices through the re­
cession, and prices for the 
lower quality meats have 
been especially depressed 
since August. It has been a 
good time for consumers to 
stock their freezers.

Historically, livestock has 
been a very cyclical industry, 
but the general trend for 
world-wide red meat produc­
tion was upward since World 
War II until 1978, when the 
production turned flat.

In the United States, per 
capita beef and veal supply 
reached a peak of 99 retail 
pounds in 1977 and is ex­
pected to be about 80 in 
1983. Total red meat and 
poultry supplies per capita in 
1983 may be a record of 
about 210 retail pounds.

There have been tempor­
ary increases in marketing 
beef in the U.S. and Austra- 
lia, but 1983 world produc- ^  
tion is not expected to total ^  
any more than 1982. This ^  
scenario suggests shorter ^  
supplies of total meat and ^  
poultry for the next couple of 
years and if economic reco- ^  
very continues, higher pric- ^
AC o«.A U lr^ U ,  VV

slaughter of dairy cows, ag­
gravating an already badly- 
depressed market.

Because livestock, espec­
ially cattle, have a long pro­
duction cycle and require 
long range planning, sudden 
changes in economic condi­
tions and related govern­
ment or trade policies gen­
erally result in wide varia­
bility in livestock and meat 
prices.

In the past, little attention 
has been given to the impact 
of U.S. agricultural policies 
on the livestock industry,” 
Farris said, “ and little at­
tention has been given to 
reducing trade barriers in 
meat by international trade 
organizations.

NEW SADDLES & SADDLE REPAIR 
Riding Equipment 
Custom Made Belts 
Western Art & Gifts 

Chaps

BLEVINS SADDLERY
Plenty of Parking Trailer Pull Through 

717 W. 29th San Angelo, TX. 
(915)658-7915

Fur Buyer will be in Ozena 

at WHITl House CO. each Sunday

4:15 p.m. till 4:45 p.m. 
beginning Dec. 11th

Halhttsville, Tx 77964 5 1 2 -7 9 8 -5 0 5 7
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A t  t h e  L a n d  B a n k . ..
good records 

can save time when 
you need money.

Today, farm records are useful for more than 
just taxes. Good records can be used in planning 
improvements or expansion. They can also help 
you arrange financing.. .because good farm records 
help establish your management capability.

The people at your Federal Land Bank 
Association know the part good records play in 
the wise use of credit. And that can save valuable 
time in the loan process.

The next time you need money to reach a 
long-range goal, talk to the long-term lender who 
understands how to use records to arrange 
constructive financing. Talk to 
your Land Bank Association.

The Land Bank

proved demand coupled with ^ 
shorter supplies. ^

In a recent study, for the ^  
Texas Agricultural Experi- ^  
ment Station, entitled, ^  
“ World Trends in Livestock ^  
M arketing,”  Farris says, ^  
“ The greatest problem in ^  
recent times in the livestock *  
industry throughout the mar- 
ket economies of the world is *  
price ii;.stability, and there is 
not likely to be much change ^  
through the 1980’s.” The re- -X* 
sponse has been to shift to ^  
more crops and less b- f •¥: 
especially in the Souther ’X* 
tern U.S. and in some beef 
exporting countries. ^

In many countries, the ^  
government attempts to sta- ^  
bilize the price of meat at

Dale’s Electric
R esid en tia l-C om m ercia l-Ind iistria l

Ditch Witch Services 
We sell Berkley Water Pumps

R efrigeration  R epairs

F ree Estim ates
24 Hr. Service

P h . 3 9 2 -2 8 0 1
Day or Ni« l̂it

Fully Insured
D ale H obson, O wner
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Michael Smith 
217 N. Main 
Sonora, Texas 

S87-2777

AUTO PARTS STORES

HOUDIIV GUT IDERS

Cal Custom Quartz Halogen 
Driving Lights
Complete kit, includes two 
lights, wire, switch and fuse.
#25150 Am ber, #23155 Clear

Mr. Casket 
Uklversal S-Speed 
Street Shifter
Hts most popular 
applications. #7656

4 7 “
coJo
Haad Cleaaer
Use wltti or without 
woter. 18 oz. |1109

V.19

CAROUEST 
Teddy Bear
Lovable, soft Teddy by 
California Stuffed 
Toys. Measures 
over 1 1 "

Schauer 10 Amp 
Battery Charger
12 volt automatic/ 
manual charger. 
#CRMF612

SohauBP.

Proven Vain® 
Air Shocks
Air adjustable shocks 
with air lines in 
complete kit.

COT A PARTS PROBLEM?
Ask a Qualified counterman. 

Only CAROUEST has them. 5995
•pr.

Prices good th ru  Dec. 3 1 ,1 9 8 3  at participating CAROUEST Auto Parts Stores.
AT MOST LOCATIONS

J.W. MOTOR PARTS CO.
60611th Street Ozena - 392-2343

SPC-2

1 JOB Avc.  J.
retail and/or the price of ^ 5 k J k * * * ? k :k : l :* J k :k J k ;k * ? k 5 h 5 k .* h * * * > l i* * * * * * 5 i« * * > H * '. | i* * *  
livestock. In the European 
Community (EC) and in Ja­
pan livestock prices are sup­
ported at a high level com­
pared to world markets by 
restricting imports and at­
tempting to maintain prices 
within a narrow range. The 
EC, which used to be the 
world’s largest importer of 
beef, is now subsidizing ex­
ports because beef is priced 
so high that consumers sub­
stitute other food products.

In Communist and some 
Socialist countries the price 
of meat and livestock is set 
by the government. This 
generally reduces the incen­
tive for quality and often 
results in shortages.

In the United States, ef­
forts by the government to 
stabilize or support the price 
of other agricultural enter­
prises often has “ spill over” , 
effects into the livestock 
enterprises.

The 1983 program for re­
ducing grain supplies (PIK) 
has increased production 
costs for livestock produc­
ers. The recent proposed leg­
islation to reduce dairy pro­
duction threatens to step up

v w v w

KAYGRAMAN 
Bride-elect of 
Mark Tillman 

has made her pottery 
selection 

at
THE COTTAGE 
COLLECTION

Greot Sow ings Poppin’ Up

INVENTORY REDUCTION

'IT
(ELECTRIC

Cleans. 
j jC L O G G E D  P IP E S ,  
l i p R A IN S ,  S E W E R S  

{NO DIGGING NO DAMAGE

CAROUEST: the R ight Place to  buy auto parts. 
R ight Parts • R ight Price • R ight Advice. “

Raul DeLaRosa
Plumbing &  Serv. 

Ditch Digging 

Ph. 392-2726 

1206 Ave. F.

Dress and Work Shirts from Ely 

Prices Range from $ ^ 5 0  to ^ 1 5  95

REYNOLDS TIRES ,
750x16 TRACTION TT

STRATTON TIRES
750x 16 SUPER HWY. KING ^ A A  SO  P ' " *

STRATTON TIRES $on00p««t-.
950x16.5 SUPER HWY. KING

STRATTON TIRES
H78x1S SUPER HWY. KING  J O O p ' " * ^ " *

GENERAL TIRES
P235/85R16 AIHBRISTEEL RADIAL  $ 9 5  » s

Everyday Low Prices 

On Lee And Michelin Tires

All Prices Include Mounting And Balancing 

Sale Tax Excluded
Prices Good While Supply lasts NO RAINCHECKS

Wool Growers Central Storage
607 Ave. H Ozona, T exas
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Winning recipes from Pecan Show l^hristmas Trees 1
Baker Trailer Park

For your holiday baking we 
give you the winning food 
recipes from the annual 
Crockett County Pecan 
Show.

CARROT CAKE 
Lou Deaton 

1st Place in Cakes
3 cups grated carrots 
2 cups flour
2 cups sugar 
2 teaspoons soda 
1 teaspoon baking powder 
Vi teaspoon salt 
1 teaspoon cinnamon
4 eggs, well beaten 
VA cups oil
1 teaspoon vanilla 
1 cup pecans, chopped 
Mix well in large bowl, 

sugar, oil and eggs. Stir in 
dry ingredients. Add grated 
raw carrots, pecans and van­
illa. Spoon batter into 3 
greased and floured 9” cake 
pans. Bake at 350® for 30 
minutes. Spread cream 
cheese frosting between lay­
ers and on top of cake while 
still warm.

Frosting
1-16 oz. pkg. powdered 

sugar
1-8 oz. cream cheese 
Vi cup butter

1 teaspoon vanilla 
1 cup pecans chopped 
Combine, blend and stir in 

first four ingredients. Add 
pecans.

BAR-B-QUED PECANS 
Kim Baker 

1st in Miscellaneons
2- 3 cups pecan halves 
Vi cup butter
1 tablespoon Worchester- 

shire sauce
Vi teaspoon celery salt 
Vi teaspoon seasoned salt 
Vi teaspoon paprika 
Vi teaspoon onion salt 
Vi teaspoon garlic salt 
1 teaspoon hickory smoke 

salt or liquid smoke
3- 5 drops Tabasco Sauce 
Heat oven to 200°. In

shallow roasting pan melt 
butter in oven. Mix all sea­
sonings together in a large 
bowl"pour melted butter 
over seasonings. Add pecans 
and stir until coated. Pour 
mixture back into roasting 
pan. Spread evenly and bake 
1 hour stirring every 15 
minutes.

PE-CO-NUT CANDY 
1st Place-Candy 

J. J. Baker
‘/i lb. butter-softened

Pecos
River Crossing

Deer Storage Food Fuel 

Ammunition

R. V. Park with all hook-ups and 

free satellite T.V.

Now in stock, meats from the 

Mertzon Locker Plant. 

Interstate 10 between 

Ozona and Ft. Stockton.

2 lb. powdered sugar 
2 cups ground pecans 
1 cup coconut 
1 can sweetened con­

densed milk
1 teaspoon vanilla 
12 oz. chocolate chips 
1 cake Gulfwax 
Mix butter, powdered su­

gar, pecans, coconut, milk 
and vanilla. Roll in balls and 
store in refrigerator for 3 
hours. Melt chips and wax in 
double boiler. Dip balls in 
chocolate and put on wax 
paper to dry.

MICROWAVE BRITTLE 
Robin Myers 

1st Place Candies
1 cup pecans 
1 cup sugar
Vi cup white corn syrup 
Vs teaspoon salt 
1 teaspoon Baking Soda 
1 teaspoon vanilla
1 teaspoon butter
In a IVi quart casserole, 

stir together pecans, sugar, 
syrup and salt. Cook 8 min­
utes at high, stirring well 
after 4 minutes. Add butter 
and vanilla. Cook one minute 
longer at High. Add baking 
soda and quickly stir until 
light and foamy. Immediate­
ly pour onto lightly buttered 
baking sheet. Spread out 
thin.

CHRISTMAS NUTS 
Amy Easterwood 
1 st-Mlscellaneous

2 Vi teaspoon water 
1 egg white
3 or 4 cups pecans 
V4 cup sugar
y* teaspoon salt 
1 teaspoon cinnamon 
‘/i teaspoon cloves 
Vi teaspoon allspice 
Vi teaspoon nutmeg 
Combine sugar, salt and 

spices. Stir into lightly bea­
ten egg white. Add water 
and blend. Add nuts and stir 
till coated. Place on pressed 
cookie sheet and bake 30 
minutes at 275% -45 minutes 
at 250.

BANANA NUT BREAD 
Kaleta Shepperson 
First Place-Breads

V2 cup butter 
1 cup sugar, cream well, 

add 2 eggs, beat thoroughly. 
Add 2 large ripe bananas 
mashed. Sift and measure 2 
cups flour and 1 teaspoon 
soda. Mix and add Vi cup 
nuts. Bake at 350° for 1 hour. 
Makes 1 loaf. Bake in 9X5 
loaf pan.

CREAMY CHOCOLATE 
FUDGE 

Janet HUl
First Place in Candies

2 cups chocolate chips 
1 can Eagle Brand milk 
1 Vi cup chopped pecans 
Melt chips and milk toget­

her in microwave or double 
boiler. Sitr until smooth. Add 
pecans. Pour into a greased 
foil lined 9” pan. Chill and 
remove from pan and cut into 
squares.

PEANUT BUTTER 
FUDGIES 

Tasha Nowell 
First Place-Cookies

Vi cup milk
1 stick butter 
4 cups sugar 
V2 cup pecans
2 cups oatmeal
V2 cup peanut butter
1 teaspoon vanilla
Vi cup Hershey’s cocoa 
Mix in saucepan milk, 

butter, sugar and pecans. 
Bring to a boil; cook 1 min­
ute. Remove from heat and 
add oatmeal, peanut butter, 
vanilla, and chocolate. Spoon 
drop on wax paper and let 
cool. Makes about 2 dozen.

PEACH-PECAN 
PARTY TARTS 
Jeanette Bailey 
First Place-Pies 

Filling; 1 cup frozen pea­
ches (thawed-drained-

mashed)
Vi cup sugar
Cook over medium heat 

until sugar dissolves. Add: 1 
cup finely chopped pecans, 
Vi cup Amaretto liqueur, 
juice of ‘/i lime.

Bring back to a boil stirr­
ing constantly. Set aside to 
cool. Do not overcook.

Using two 9” pie crusts 
make small finger food size 
pies. I have a mold I use for 
very small tarts, as they are 
quite rich. Bake at 425° until 
slightly browned. Top with a 
teaspoon of Cool Whip from 
a small carton to which you 
have added 1 tablespoon 
Amaretto. These tarts may 
be made ahead of time and 
frozen. Yield: Approximately 
75 small finger food serv­
ings.

CHEESE LOAF OR BALL 
Kaleta Shepperson 

First Place 
Misceilaneous

6-3 oz. pkgs. cream cheese 
‘/i lb. sharp yellow cheese
2 tablespoons Mayonnaise 

and small amount thick

“Pick a Phone, 
Any Phone?

Just because a phone will plug into your 
wall jack. It doesn’t mean that it will work.
Why?
Well, for instance, let's look at a phone that 
will be used on a party-line. Since 
customers share a common line to the 
telephone company switching office, each
Even if you have a ‘Private Line’, you
Single-line customers may also have special 
dialing or ringing requirements that are not 
apparent. So, they purchase a new phone 
and sadly discover that it won't work. This is 
especially true for customers who may be

Trading in your diai phone couid be
The joy of owning your very own 'Touch 
Tone' phone could turn into tragedy if your 
phone line is designated for a dial or pulse 
phone. A pushbutton 'pulse' phone will work 
on most lines, since it also duplicates the 
signal of a regular dial phone. However, a

phone has it's own special ringing-cycle 
setting which allows the phone to know 
when it should ring on the party-line.

stiii may have probiems.
considering a cordless telephone or even a 
universal dialing telephone, a clock radio 
that offers telephone access capability or 
any other special telephone service.

asking for trouble.
'Touch Tone' phone emits a 'beeping' tone 
that requires special equipment to 
recognize the signal. Some dial phones, 
even if you have Touch Call Service, are 
not compatable under certain 
circumstances.

So, if you decide to buy a new telephone, take the time to stop by your 
neighborhood GTE Phone Mdrt and see if your particular line has any special 
limitations. It could possibly save you a lot of frustration and money.

cream
1-8 oz. can crushed pine­

apple, well drained.
1 cup chopped pecans
Vi cup chopped green 

pepper
2 tablespoon green onion
1 teaspoon Lawry’s sea­

soned salt
Leave cheese out of re­

frigerator for about 2 hours 
so that it will be soft. Stir, 
mix pineapple, Vi cups pe­
cans, green pepper and on­
ion, and seasoned salt in 
large mixing bowl. Form into 
a loaf or can make one large 
ball or two small ones, roll in 
remaining pecans. I prefer a 
dash or so of garlic salt, and 
celery salt. Also a small cube 
of Jalapeno pepper cheese. 
All are optional.

MINT DOLLIES 
Kaleta Shepperson 
First Place-Cookies

1 cup Lorna Doone short­
bread cookies, crushed very 
fine.

Vi cup butter, melted
1 cup flaked coconut
1 cup semi-sweet choco­

late morsels
1 cup pecans, chopped 

semifine
2 squares (2 ozs.) semi- 

sweet chocolate
2 tablespoons butter or 2 

ozs. green summer coating.
1 can (14 oz.) sweetened 

condensed milk
4 drops oil of pepper­

mint, or to taste
Mix crumbs with melted 

butter, and evenly press into 
bottom of 7X11-in. baking 
pan. Add one layer each of 
coconut, chocolate morsels, 
and pecans-in order listed. 
Add 2 drops oil of pepper­
mint to condensed milk, and 
mix well. Evenly spoon over 
dry mixture. Bake in pre­
heated 350 degree oven, 25 
or 30 minutes. Do not 
overbake. Remove to rack 
and cool in pan to room 
temperature. In double boil­
er, over very low heat, melt 
chocolate or green summer 
coating, with butter. Add 2 
drops oil of peppermint, and 
mix well. Drizzle over top, 
tilting pan to spread evenly. 
Refrigerate until firm and cut 
with sharp knife. Store in 
tightly covered container. 
Yield: 32 squares.

♦Summer coating can be 
purchased at candy stores.

PECAN TASSIES
Sabrina Easterwood 
First Place-CooUes

2 (3 oz.) pkg. cream cheese 
softened

2 sticks (V̂i lb.) oleo, 
softened

2 cups sifted flour
Mix crust ingredients well 

and chill one hour. After 
chilling, form 48 small balls 
and press into miniature 
muffin tins.

Filling
3 tablespoons oleo, melted
2 Vi cups brown sugar 

packed
3 beaten eggs
1 Vi teaspoon vanilla
l ‘/i cups chopped pecans
While dough is chilling, 

mix oleo, brown sugar, eggs, 
and vanilla to make filling. 
Keep pecans separate.Put Vi 
teaspoon pecans in bottom of 
each shell. Add 1 teaspoon 
filling to shell. Top with */i 
teaspoon pecans. Bake at 
350° about 30 minutes. Cool 
completely before removing 
from pan.

Bonuses
taxable

Taxpayers who were fortu­
nate enough to earn awards 
or bonuses this year are 
being reminded by IRS that 
these amounts should be in­
cluded as income on their 
1983 federal income tax re­
turns.

'The IRS says rewards and 
bonuses include prizes such 
as a paid vacation trip award­
ed for attaining sales goals. 
If the prize or award is in the 
form of goods or services, its 
fair market value is the 
amount the taxpayer must 
include as income.

If the employer pays the 
bonus or award at a future 
time, it is not taxable until it 
is received by the employee, 
the IRS says.

If an employer distributes 
holiday remembrances such 
as turkeys, hams, or other 
items of nominal worth, the 
value of these gifts is not 
taxable. However, if cash, 
gift certificates or similar 
items that may be easily 
exchanged for cash are giv­
en, the value of the gifts is 
taxable.

9th and Ave. H.

30C Z = D < K

CEILING FAN

iS8L6
Save On Energy 

Buy A Ceiling Fan

While There On Sale

REGULAR $169.95

Sole $ j 3 0 o o

REGULAR $119.95

Sale $ 9 Q 0 0

South Texas 
lumber Co.

1308 Ave. E. 392-2634

1308 Ave. E. TOUT 392-2634

o m w s m r
Christmas Trimmings For Your Tree

CHRISTMAS TREES
4F t.u p  to7 Ft.

WREATHS 

$ 1 0 9 5  _ * 2 2 ’ ^

CANDLES 
AND

CANDLE RINGS 
CENTER PIECES

GARLANDS
TABLE CLOTHS, NAPKINS, AND 

PLATES TO MATCH
Also Featuring

Christmas Heritage Dinnerware

South Texas 
Lumber Co.

General Telephone i d t a
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The Scientists Tell Me...

Some Insect Pests Ride W inds 
To Disperse From W inter Quarters

Cafeteria 
Menu

Helpful HMits on Holiday Driving

By>Robert L. Haney
TAES Science Writer
Destructive crop insects 

such as the corn earworm 
and tobacco budworm appar­
ently use the strong winds 
out of the south to transport 
them from Mexico and South 
Texas into Central Texas and 
Arkansas, according to 
USD A entomologists and ag­
ricultural engineers at Texas 
A&M University and a clim­
atologist at Louisiana State 
University.

“ If true, and there is 
strong circumstantial evi­
dence to support this theory, 
the problem is of consider­
able economic importance to 
both the U.S. and Canada,” 
says A.W, Hartstack, 
U.S.D.A. agricultural engi­
neer, who has guided the 
research team working on 
this research for USDA/ARS 
and Cotton Incorporated, in 
cooperation with the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Sta­
tion.

“ At least five different 
pests in their adult (moth) 
stage may be involved in 
such migrations,” Hartstack 
said, “which poses all kinds 
of complications for produc­
ers and entomologists. They 
must not only be prepared to 
cope with insect pests as they 
hatch or emerge from dia- 
panse in their own area but 
also a sizeable number of 
invaders from other areas, 
and at an earlier date.

“ Circumstantial evidence 
suggests that in March of 
1982, there was a major 
migration of corn earworm 
adults into Texas and the 
lower Mississippi River Val­
ley.

“The day that the first 
corn earworm moth, Helio- 
tUs zea (Boddie), was caught 
was not related to increases 
in temperature, as expected 
from increases in latitude 
from south to north.

“ Large increases in phere- 
mone trap captures of moths 
occurred in Texas, Eastern 
Louisiana, Arkansas, and

Mississippi in March, that 
seemed to be related to the 
nearly continuous south to 
north airflow that occurred 
from March 11 to 20.

“ In 1981, we developed 
circumstantial evidence that 
suggested there was a major 
migration of corn earworm 
adults into areas around 
College Station, Texas and 
Portland, Arkansas.

“ I say ‘circumstantial’ be­
cause the moths we trapped 
weren’t marked so they could 
be positively identified as 
originating in Mexico or 
South Texas.

“ However, we do have 
emergence cages in these 
areas and the peak phero­
mone trap catch was esti­
mated to be 19 and 33 days 
ahead of the peak local

Temple

Baptist
Crusade

The members of Temple 
Baptist Church of Ozona 
invite the public to attend a 
Bible Crusade being hosted 
this week at the church. It 
will begin Sunday morning, 
December 11, at 10:00 a.m., 
then nightly at 7:30 p.m. 
Sunday night through Satur­
day, Dec. 17.

Every visiting family re­
presented at four of these 
Bible-preaching services will 
receive a copy of the entire 
New Testament Bible on cas­
sette tape.

Plan now to attend these 
services and help the mem­
bers of Temple Baptist 
Church make this a very 
memorable holiday season 
for Christians. Guest speaker 
will be Rev. Don Provines, 
pastor of Live Oak Baptist 
Church of Sonora, Texas.

diapause emergence at Col­
lege Station and Portland, 
respectively.

“ In 1982, pheromone traps 
were operated at 50 loca­
tions across the southern 
U.S. Most of the traps were 
installed by March 1 and at 
some locations such as in 
California, Arizona and Flori­
da, corn earworm moths 
were captured immediately 
indicating presence of moths 
before March 1.

“ We had concluded that 
the corn earworm moths, 
trapped before early April in 
1981, had to come from sour­
ces south of College Sta­
tion. The 1982 study added 
additional evidence that long 
range movement of these 
moths is occurring during 
early spring.

“ Not only did the com 
earworm moths again appear 
before tobacco budworm 
moths but they were caught 
two weeks earlier than in 
1981, and in greater num­
bers. The large catches, as 
mentioned earlier, were dur­
ing a continuous run, for ten 
days of winds from the south, 
between March 10-20, 1982.

“ Long-range movement of 
these moths into the south­
eastern U.S. seemingly was 
negligible during 1982. And 
no evidence of significant 
movement of tobacco bud- 
worms into Texas and the 
lower Mississippi Valley was 
found.

“ However, study of wea­
ther patterns and our exper­
ience with trapping leads us 
to conclude that a number of 
similar insects have the po­
tential in some years to 
invade other areas and could 
cause a rapid build-up ahead 
of their usual time.

“ We believe that if pro­
ducers and entomologists are 
alert to the threat of these 
early-season insect invaders 
they can be prepared to con­
trol them before they reach 
economically destructive 
numbers,” Hartstack con­
cluded.

Mmidmy
Spanish Steak 
Mashed Potatoes 
Vegetable Salad 
Pear Half 
Corabread

Tuesday
Hamburger on Bun 
Pork & Beans 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Applesauce

Wednesday
Chili Dogs 
Cheese Strips 
French Fries 
Sliced Peaches 

MERRY CHRISTMAS & 
HAPPY NEW YEAR

Turf grass 
big
business
There’s a lot of turf in 

Texas-turfgrass, that is.
Taking into consideration 

golf courses, parks, ceme­
teries, athletic fields, 
grounds around business es­
tablishments and home 
lawns (but excluding high­
way rights-of-way), Texas 
boasts more than a million 
acres of turfgrass.

And the Texas turfgrass 
business is a booming one. 
Each year some S750 million 
are spent to maintain the one 
million acres of turf.

Ail this points to the im­
portance of the turfgrass 
industry in the state and is a 
major reason for the annual 
Texas Turfgrass Conference 
and Show.

Even if you consider 
yourself the world’s best 
driver, winter weather re­
quires paying added atten­
tion to the rules of the road.

Here’s some advice from 
the Independent Insurance 
Agents of America (IIAA) 
that can help you drive 
more safely this holiday 
season;

•  Keep in mind that ice 
at 30°F has proven to be 
more slick than ice at zero 
degrees. Take extra care 
when driving slick roads and 
be sure your car has snow 
tires on.

•  Certain items should 
be placed in the car in case 
you find yourself stranded, 
or if your tires lose traction. 
For lost traction, keep sand, 
cat litter or some sort 
of traction mats on hand. 
Flashlights and blankets, as 
well as canned drinks and 
packaged foods, could be 
lifesavers if your car breaks 
down on a deserted road.

•  Begin driving in win­
ter weather by slowly accel­

erating to determine if your 
wheels may spin—if they 
don’t, reduce your speed 
and drive carefully. If they 
do, use the steering wheel. 
Steer the car in the direc­
tion you want the front to 
go and the rest of the car 
will probably skid out side­
ways. Do not brake until 
you have regained control 
of the steering wheel. Apply 
gradual pressure on the 
brakes.

•  While driving, remem­
ber to keep sufficient dis­
tance between you and oth­
er cars. It takes three to 
nine times as far to come to 
a stop on snow and ice.

•  Be sure to have anti­
freeze in your windshield 
washer as well as some in 
your cooling system.

•  If you’re stranded, 
stay with your car. Exer­
cise to keep warm. Use a 
flashlight. Leave the win­
dow open just a crack, if 
the engine is running, for 
some fresh air. Use flares 
if you have them.

OAKWOOD
MOBILE HOMES 

658-8569
4422N.Chod. San Angelo, TX.

NO MONTHLY PAYMENT
FOR 90 DAYS
OfTNEW HOMB 

LIMITED TIME ONLY

(OAKWOOD
OPEN SUNDAYS

Call Mike Clark 
For More Details 
Phone 658-8569

EQUAl HOt'SINC
OPPOBTUNITV

BID AMD BATH

G O Um tT

BEAUTIFUL 
ENERGY EFFICIENT 

READI-BILT MOVABLE HOMES'
TOWN & COUNTRY 

HOMEBUILDERS
2920 North Bryant 658-6053 Son Angelo, TX.

SCULPTURE
EXQUISITE 

BRASS MIRRORS
TABLE LINENS
JACK WHITE 
ORIGINALS

1 856 SQ. FT. 3 BED­
ROOM ROCK FIREPLACE 
SKYLIGHTS CATHEDRAL 
CEILING WITH FAN ASH 
CABINETS WITH RAISED 
PANEL DOOR ASH 
PANELING, RANGE DISH 
WASHER, COMPACTER 
CERAMIC TILE BATHS 
HEATING & COOLING 
ENERGY EFFICIENT.

FURNITURE CARPET

WINDOW COVIKIHGS
--- ------------------- , - j ------------------------

BKOWH fURHITURE
906Ave.t. 392-2341

1512SQ.FT.
3 Bedrooms,
2 Baths, Cathedral 
Ceiling, Bay Window 
& Dining, Ash 
Cabinets, Skylights.

1400 SQ. FT. 3 BEDROOMS 
ROCK FIREPLACE, ASH 
CABINETS WITH RAISED PANEL 
DOORS RANGE, DISHWASHER, 
SPACIOUS UTILITY ROOM, 
MASTER BEDROOM HAS MARBLE 
TOP VANITY, 2 W A LK -IN ­
CLOSETS, CATHEDRAL CEILING & 
FANS. ENERGY EFFICIENT HOME.

PRICE INCLUDES
• MOVING
• FOUNDATION
• SEPTIC TANK
• HOOKUPS

LOANS AVAILABLE 
VA-FHA-CONV.

OPEN MON.-FRI. 
8A.M .-5P.M .

SAT.
9A.M .-5P.M .

CUSTOM BUILT TO M UT YOUR MUDS
The 38th annual confer­

ence and show ts slated for 
Dec. 12-14 at the Adam’s 
Mark Hotel in Houston. Dub- 
le expects more than 500
individuals to attend, includ- H  1 1
ing grounds maintenance H J W I I
personnel and managers of H  I  ■
golf courses, parks, athle- ■  B  f l  B  f l
tic fields and cemeteries. B

One of the conference 
highlights will be the open­
ing session on Monday after­
noon, Dec. 12, says Duble.
Titled “Turfgrass Research 
in Texas,” the session will 
feature discussions on the 
latest research findings relat­
ing to new grass varieties, 
water conservation, winter 
injury and new products.

The conference will also 
feature concurrent sessions
ment ’̂*̂ *‘‘LaIn^Gr*wn^  ̂ I ̂ *^****^ ̂  coupoH ot Bm IIs III Soii Angolo ond recQive an extra 15% off your purchofes for 
Maintenance’ ’ and ̂ “Golf I gm gnfjrf ||gy, y|||| app||ei to folo SALE or REGULAR Price Merchandise. This is our way of 

of these sessions will deal I toying '1HANKY0U 0I0NA, For Shopping At BEALLS".M u l t I  COUPON EXPIRES DECEMBER 24,1983.
vation, and weed, disease 
and insect control.

CHRBTMASOimDEA•  • • • •

Move up to 500 ibs........dump it where you
need it with o handy Heald Houier

Hauler handles hundreds of toting 
jobs on farm, ranch, construction site, 
golf course. Speeds delivery of parts or 
tools, hauls feed, seed, dirt, fertilizer. 
Carries a 500 lb. payload plus driver and 
passenger to save time and labor. Hauler 
features an 11 H.P., 399 cc, 4-cycle, Syn­
chro-Balanced Briggs & Stratton electric 
start engine or a 16 H.P., two cylinder op­
posed, 656 cc, 4-cycle Briggs & Stratton 
electric start engine, forward and reverse 
gears and an automatic torque converter 
transmission. No shifting, yet you get the

right speed or power gear" for any job. 
Metal side and bottom panels welded to 2" 
tubular steel frame protect engine, gears 
and driver from mud, etc. Two, telescoping 
front shocks: full, back support double 
seat, and wide, low pressure tires smooth 
the ride. Less than 4 ' wide. Hauler’s bed 
measures 44’/4x40"x11". Tailgate, hinged 
top and bottom, swings free to dump or 
can be locked to extend bed to 4 -t- ft. for 
longer loads. Square corner holes allow 
side racks. Hydraulic disc brakes with park­
ing brake standard. Many options.

As seen in ''Mechanics Illustrated" & "Progressive Farmer' 
Houlers, Trykes & Bikes in Stock

HOOKER AUTOMOTIVE
3036 W. Harris 
Mon.-Frl. 8:00-5:30

SAVr ANGELO
Res. 949-9258

049-6474 
Sot. A Son. ANYTiME V

I have a problem.
Can you 

help me?**
When you call Energas’ Ozona office, you 
will probably talk with Donna Hightower.

You have the right person. She can 
answer your questions or put you in touch 
with someone who can. Or, if you require 
service within your home, she will arrange 
for our people to come out at your con­
venience. Besides immediate access to 
office personnel, she has instant com­
munications with service people out on 
the job.

So. when you call our office, you can 
depend on the right answers from the 
right people.

E n e r g a s  p e o p l e  c a n  d o  a n d  w a n t  t o .

E N E R G Y

“It’s great to have the people of the O zona  
office represent Energas. I am proud of the job they 
are doing and the spirit in which they are doing it. ”

Charles V aughan  
President, Energas Com pany ,Sr. Customer Accounts Clerk
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1983 BASKETBALL TOURNAMENT 
ALL STAR-L. to R. Richard Morales, 
Steve Sanchez, Harvey Fierro, Alan 
Morales, Bobhy Templeton, Joe Hough,

Lance Powell, Mark Ray and MVP 
Doyle Weishuhn. [See story for home­
towns] [OHS photo]

C ounty h osp ita l board  
in regu lar  m e e tin g
The regular meeting of the 

Crockett County Hospital 
Board was held at 7:00 p.m, 
December 8, at the Ozona 
National Bank.

Present were President 
Dan Pullen, board members 
Bonnie Warth, A1 Ramirez, 
Leandro Flores, Bob Falkner 
and Jodie Sessom. Others 
present were Don Hopkins, 
administrator; Dottie Tuttle, 
assistant administrator; Jac- 
quie King, Ramona Turnley, 
Tom Cameron, Elvira Calk- 
well, Dr. and Mrs. Don 
Carlisle and Dr. Robert 
Owensby.

Don Hopkins presented 
the board with three lists of 
bad debts he had been at­
tempting to collect. Bob 
Falkner moved that List #1 
be charged off. Jode Sessom 
seconded. Motion passed. 
Lists #2 and 3 are to be 
pursued further until a col­
lection agency is employed. 
Tom Cameron recommended 
that the debts for less than 
$500.00 be filed on in Small 
Claims Court, however, this 
issue is to be discussed with 
the Commissioners Court. 
Falkner made a motion that 
lists 1, 2, 3, and 4 be 
declared bad debts so that 
legal action can be taken.

Leandro seconded the mo­
tion.

Falkner reported the am­
bulance committee had not 
met. Dr. Carlisle has been 
appointed to be on the Ad­
visory Board of the Concho 
Valley Coun<^ and will he 
reporting in ,the future for 
plans and redbmmendations.

Eighty-eight claims for a 
total of $52,000.00 in addi­
tion to 119 certified letters 
for $45,000.00 due has been 
worked on this past month. 
Approximately 25% have 
been heard from, according

to Hopkins.
Bonnie Warth moved that 

the meeting adjourn and Pul­
len requested a short Ex­
ecutive Session.

The meeting was opened 
and Bonnie Warth moved 
that Mr. Hopkins be given  ̂
raise effective January 1, to 
$35,000.00. Jodie Sessom 
seconded the motion. It was 
passed. Mr. Hopkins was 
commended on the excellent 
job he is performing and 
encouraged to continue do­
ing so.

Beware of persons 
posing as IRS employees

Persons posing as emplo­
yees of the Internal Reve­
nue Service occasionally at­
tempt to harass taxpayers or 
to collect money for what the 
imposter claims are unpaid 
taxes, the IRS says.

The IRS advises that tax­
payers should request to see 
the credentials of any indi­
vidual claiming to represent 
the IRS. Any IRS employee 
who makes contact with the 
public is required to carry

distinctive identification and 
must show this when con­
ducting official business. Al­
so, usually taxpayers who 
owe money to the IRS will 
receive written notification 
before being contacted in 
person.

Taxpayers who doubt the 
validity of the credentials 
offered can verify the per­
son’s employment by con­
tacting the nearest IRS of­
fice.

Lionettes 
place 3rd 
in tourney
In the first game of the 

Ozona Tournament the Lion­
ettes defeated Lake View 
J.V. with a score of 35-33.

The team had a slow 
start and had to come from 
behind late in the game 
to clinch the victory. High 
point was Sherri Buckner 
with 17 points, 9 rebounds 
and 3 steals. Zelda Mun­
oz, Kristal Williams, and 
Donna Sanchez contributed 4 
points each. Lydia Maldona­
do, Vanessa Miller and Rita 
DeLaRosa each had 2 points. 
Other rebounders were Kris­
tal with 7, Lydia 6, Kim 4, 
Zelda 4, Vanessa 4, Rita 3, 
and Donna 1.

The second round of the 
tournament the Ozona girls 
were defeated by Fort Stock- 
ton 31-47. The Lionettes 
never seemed to get their 
feet moving on defense and 
had trouble hitting the bas­
ket as well as their free 
throws. In this game the high 
scorer was Kristal Williams 
with 14 points, Sherri 10, 
Vanessa 3, Lydia 2 and Rita 
with 2. Leading rebounders 
were Kristal with 11, Lydia 7, 
Sherri 5, Vanessa 3, Rita 3, 
Kim 3, Julie 2 and Christy 
had 1. Kristal Williams 
played an outstanding over­
all game while Christy Parks 
came off the bench to play a 
very good defensive game.

Ozona defeated Wall on 
the final day of the tourna­
ment with a score of 40-35 to 
capture third place in the 
tournament. The scoring was 
distributed evenly in the 
game. High point was Lydia 
with 11, Donna Sanchez was 
close behind with 10 points, 
Kristal had 8, Vanessa had 7, 
and Sherri had 4. Leading 
rebounders were Sherri with 
9, Donna 5, Kristal 4, Ly­
dia 4, Zelda 4, Vanessa 2, 
Kim 1 and Rita 1.

The game against Wall 
was one of the Lionette’s 
best games of the season, 
upping their record to 5 wins 
and 4 losses.

Crane won first place in 
the tournament, Fort Stock- 
ton was second, Ozona was 
third, and Junction captured 
consolation.

Turn clear water goblets 
into a holiday setting by in­
verting them and placing 
a colorful Christmas ball 
inside each. Place a tail red 
taper on top of each goblet 
base. Arrange greens all 
around.

GIRLS ALL-STAR TEAM as selected in 
the annual Ozona basketball tourna­
ment. L. to r. the girls are Ann Garza, 
Kristal Williams, Karen Moore, Sarah

Hernandez, Jo MitcheU and LaWonza 
Mitchell, MVP. [see story for home­
towns] [OHS photo]

French Canadians, believing that it is unlucky if a cat meows in the house on Christmas 
Eve, feed their cats especially well on December 24.

6P£0IALS...
SCHOOLCHILDREN

CALL YOUR ORDERS IN EARLY 
Open till 6 p.m. 

Monday - Saturday

HAMBURGER $ 1 49

FOR

1
1C MORE A 

SMALL COKE

COFFEE 15'
1  ^ FOR EACH REFILL

Clayton’s Village Drug
902-llth 392-2666

CHRISTMAS GIFT GUIDE ! !
WILSON or DUNLOP

* 2 ^ ^  CAN 
TENNIS BALLS

Free Stringing
With The Purchase 

Of Any Tennis Rafcket

ALL WARM-UPS
MENS-WOMENS-KIDS

15 %  0̂^
ATHLETIC SOCKS

BU Y 3 PAIRS 
GET 1 PAIR

FREE

j
Wrist Bands 

and
Head Bands

Price

SHOE DEPT.
CONVERSE-Jimmy Conners Reg. *4P=... *36®®

CONVERSE-Chris Evert Reg. *41’ .̂...........*36®®
KAEPA-DoubleTie Reg.*4P=......  ............  *38®®
PONY-No. 1 Roscoe Reg.*34’ .̂.......  ........... *31“
PONY-Fastbreak Reg. *44^ .̂.....   ’38“
AUTRY-TopSeed R eg.’29” .......   •24“

ALL GLOVES

25 %  OFF

\

Body Toner by DP
$17500

ALL
JACKETS

1 0 %  i
OFF I

I
a l l f o o t b a l l s M

INSTOCK g  

2 0 %  OFF ^

Carry Bag 
Reg. •6‘X'

MS4 904 Ave. H
C o M w i c c dia q
Ozona 392-2880
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3 BDR., 1 BATH, HOUSE
located in Crockett Hgts. 5% 
down, 13V2% financing. 
Contact First Savings & 
Loan. 392-3776. 32-tfc

One way to keep a Christ­
mas tree from drying out 
is to put ice cubes in 
the base of the stand.

For Sale

FOR SALE-1973 Cadillac,
4-dr. Sedan. Excellent con­
dition. 392-3612. 37-tfc

YARD SALE-Thursday and 
Friday. 131 Santa Rosa. 
Men’s corduroy suit, wo­
men’s rabbit fur coat. Cloth­
ing for men, women and 
boys. Knick-knacks, misc., 
shoes, 8-track tapes. 42-ltp

FOR SALE-Stereo with two 
speakers. One double bed 
with frane. Washing mach­
ine. Ph. 392-3360. 33-ltp

Help Wonted

HELP WANTED-Waitress- 
es, apply in person at El 
Chato’s Restaurant. 46-tfc

FOR SALE-Propane system 
and 110 gallon tank. Ph. 
392-3624. 42-2tp

NEEDED-Front help, cook 
and dishwasher for Red 
Apple. Good benefits and 
added bonuses. Apply to J. 
B. Miller at Firestone store.

27-tfc

FOR SALE-1975 Blazer, full 
top comes off. Also 20 ft. 
travel trailer fully self-con­
tained. Call 392-2874. 37-tfc

ON SALE NOW-Ceiling fans, 
also pecan thrashing poles. 
SOUTH TEXAS LUMBER 
CO. 40-tfc

Mobile Homes

FOR SALE BY OWNER-
14X80 1982 Riveria Mobile 
Home. 3 bedroom-2 bath. 
Call 392-3686. 42-ltp

FOR SALE-Like new, 1980 
Yamaha 650 cc Special. Call 
392-2931. 42-ltp

FOR SALE-23 ft. 1980 Shasta 
Travel Trailer. Call 392-2656.

35-tfc
FOR SALE-Chrysler boat, 
motor, trailer, 60 hp motor. 
ISVi ft. boat. Call after 6 
392-2381 or 392-3567. 36-tfc

FOR SALE-1983 double-wide 
mobile home. Call 392-2957.

42-ltc
FOR SALE-Farm, ranch, 
business and home storage, 
7x8 to 14x48 stock buildings 
and larger custom. Heavy 
duty steel. We deliver. 
Morgan, 3220 Sherwood 
Way, 944-8696. 34-tfc

SALE-All Keller Maple Din­
ing Furniture in stock, 20% 
off. Brown Furniture Com­
pany. 41-tfc

WENT BANKRUPT-Must
sell immediately. 1983-12X58 
mobile home. I will move it to 
your location. Payments 
$188.24 including insurance. 
Equity $1200. I will consider 
a trade for equity. Please call 
368-5978 or 362-2409 in Od­
essa for appointment. Ask 
for Ron. 41-2tp

Garage Sales

GARAGE SALE-#27 Crockett 
Heights. Lots of winter items 
and knick-knacks, Friday 
from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m.

42-ltp

NO PAYMENT until Feb. 
1984. Payments only $235 a 
month on a beautiful new 
14X80, 3 bdr., 2 bath. 4-bed­
room only $250 month. Low 
down payments. Free deliv­
ery and free set-up. Call 
Danny collect--915-333-4595 
After 6:30 call 332-0157, ask 
for Danny. 42-5tc

LARA CONSTRUCTION, IN C
COMPRESSOR FOUNDATION

Additions, Remodeling, Masonary, 
Painting, and Roofing on your 

home or business.

ALEJOS LARA III 392-3326

Pepe's Restaurant
Delivers food orders to your door

(No deliveries on Sundays)

Closed on Tuesdays

Cali 392 2906

peeuess ALUMINUM
PRODUCTS

• STOKM WINDOWS

• STORM DOORS
• GARDEN WINDOWS C411 392-5092

•  REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

INSTALLATION INCLUDED 

CUSTOM SIZES NO PROBLEM

Johnnys' Tree Service

•TOPPING

•TRIMMING

•REFERENCES

Good

Equipmont

Experience

Kerrvilh, Texas 78028 
1-512-896-5560

FOR SALE-24’ 1975 Nomad 
Travel Trailer. Ozona Nation­
al Bank 392-2676. 40-tfc

GIFT WRAPPING at Baker 
Trailer Park, Ave. H, Trai­
ler #8. Reasonable prices. 
Ph. 392-3630. 42-ltp

TRANSFERRING OUT OF
STATE-Need to sell 14X64, 
3 bdr. 1 ‘/2 bath mobile home. 
$1800 equity and payments 
of $263.44. Will move to your 
location. Will trade for equi­
ty. Call Mr. Burnett at 
368-5978 or 362-2409 in Od­
essa for appointment. 41-2tp

WE BUY deer hides, pecans, 
and furs. 1103 Ave. H. Glenn 
Sutton. 39-tfc

HUSBAND PLEA SING 
RECLINERS-Top of the line. 
Flexsteel and Lazyboy at 
Brown Furniture Company 

41-tfc

Miscellaneous

GIVE A GIFT that will be a 
classic--Armetale. Best se­
lection in Texas. Brown Fur­
niture Company 41-tfc

BOY SCOUT PAPER DRIVE
Troop 153 of Ozona will pick 
up all your old newspapers or 
aluminum cans. Ph. 392-3386 
or 392-3391. 40-4tp

For Rent

THE VILLAGE BARBER 
BEAUTY SHOP starting Jan­
uary 1, will have new hours. 
Open 8:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. 
Monday thru Friday. Closed 
Saturday and Sunday. 41-4tc

FOR RENT-Small house suit­
able for couple, unfurnished. 
Call 392-2344 after 4 p.m.

37-tfc

WANT TO BUY-Minerals, 
royalty and producing wells. 
Call 915/682-6191 or write 
P.O. Box 11193. 41-8ty

A DESK FOR CHRISTMAS
and every day of the year. 
Oak Rolltops, student’s and 
office. Brown Furniture Co­
mpany 41-tfc

APARTMENTS FOR RENT-
2 large bedrooms, large kit­
chen, large living room. Ap­
pliances furnished. Call 
392-3372. 23-tfc

FOR RENT-Trailer 
392-2959

spaces
31-tfc

SATELUTE TV ANTENNA
$748.00 complete. Dealers 
wanted. 913-782-7879 any­
time. 41-2tp

tOR RENT-2400 ft. waie- 
house, insulated. With office 
240 sq. ft. Phone 392-3625. 
After 6 call 392-2053. 35-tfc

BETA SIGMA PHI gift wrap­
ping booth. Saturday, Dec. 
10 & 17-9:00 a.m. to 5:00 
p.m. at village shopping 
center. Free pick up and de­
livery on 8 or more gifts. For 
pickup call 392-3551 after 
5:00 p.m. 41-2tp Business Services

ALCOHOUCS
ANONYMOUS

meetings—Sunday nights at 
Lilly Construction, 8:00 p.m. 
Ph. 392-2054 34-tfc

MOBILE HOMES
Phone 392-5020.

moved.
19-tfc

THE DEUGHT OF HER 
HEART-A Beautiful Curio. 
Brown Furniture Company

41-tfc

BLACK DIRT, caliche hauled 
and right-of-ways built. Back 
hoe service. Ph. 392-5020.

19-tfc

0  JESSE 0  
Tire Repair 

Shop
corner of Ave. 

H & ‘5th St. 
F U U T IM F  

RO AD  SERVICE
7 a.m. to 12 p.m.

..  nim-HJlrnm

Be 
YOUR
PHARMAaST 

PH 392-2608

Myatt's Carpentry

New Construction of all Types

Remodeling, pointing & cement

work of All types
phone 392-2602 Ozona, Texas 76943

NOW SELLING 

LOTS

Chandlerdale West Subdivision

Shown 5:30 p.m. to 8:30 p.m. 

weekdays or 2:00 p.m. to 

7:00 p.m. Sunday

JOHNNY JONES-Broker

392-2021 or 392-2113

ELIZABETH UPHAM-Agent

392-2883

Financing Available

DECORATED CAKES and
cookies for special occasions. 
Call PoUy at 392-3129. 39-tfc

FOR YOUR Rinsenvao 
Cleaner come to South Texas 
Lumber Co. 30-tfc

PRICE REDUCED TO SELL.
Three bedrooms, two baths, 
central heating and cooling 
by gas, insulated, new plum­
bing and carpet. Carport, 
utility building, lots of room. 
Call 392-3067 or 392-3238.

8-tfc

NEW IN OZONA
Bath RefinIshing

Worn a Damagod Bathtubs, Sinks, Coramic Tlla Roglaz- 
•d a  Rostorod to thoir Original Boauty For Only a Frac­
tion of Rapiacomont Cost.

9 A  Inr d e c o r a t o r  COLORS AVAILABLE 
n r .  GUARANTEED IN WRiTINQ

Answering 944-0143 
Service jim & Pam Sanders "•R®"'

Perma-aan'riRC.
Porcebun, Fiberglau. Acrylic Fb(lur0 FMMthlno r f

CUCO’S PLUMBING-Exper-
ienced, 392-2959, plumbing 
repairs and carpentry work.

29-tfc

MOBILE HOME MOVING 
AND LEVELING-Permit 
#1-785. Big State Movers, 
J.D. Bishop, owner. 915- 
446-3678, Junction, Tx. 
76849. 42-12tp

Real Estate

FOR SALE-3 bedroom 
house, central heat and air, 
$37,500, call before noon, 
392-3797. 35-tfc

FOR RENT-Crutches, $4.00 
a month; wheel chair, $20.00 
a month; walker, $5.00 a 
month. Clayton’s Village 
Drug. 33-tfc

HAYES
AUTO

REPAIR
‘Mechanic On Duty 

8 a.m.-6 p.m." 

1311 Ave. AA 

Phone 392-3224

LANDLORDS 
For a nominal fee, I will 
find yon a renter for your 
residential or commerclid 
property. CaU me.

4i4i
RESIDENTIAL 

NICE 1 BR. on small lot.

AUSTIN STONE-3 hr., 3 
bath-near school. 
Reduced!
COMMERCIAL LOT-
with home. 75X125 on 
I.H. 10. Good location! 
ELDORADO-Roomy 2 hr. 
2 bath, in the country. 
Owner financed. 
BARNHART-8 acres ,  
with minerals. Lg. bldg. 
& home, owner financed. 
Reduced.

4 i*

INCOME PRODUCERS

APARTMENT Complex-
Nice!
3.76 ACRES with month­
ly income.
10.09 ACRES with 6 
bldgs. & all utilities.

If you have any Real 
Estate need [bu3ing or 
selling, large or small,] 
please contact me. I may 
not have all the answers, 
but I will certainly try to 
help you.

Thank you,

JOHNNY CHILDRESS 
Realtor-Broker 

1102 Ave. E 
392-3634 or 392-5051

j JA Y  MILLER |
ICONSTRVCTION CO.|

I General Din Contractor 1
I  Oil Field Contracting |

I R oads ,  Locations, Pits |
^ D o zers ,  D u m ptrurks ,  Maintainors a

I '. Airplane Service Available k 

] 392-3243 Phone 392-2489 ̂

Pete W. Jacoby
. Real Estate

Ph. 3 9 2 - 3 0 5 9  

H o m e s - L o t s - C o m m e r c i a l  
R a n c h  P r o p e r t i e s

401 Hillcrest

Homes

Ranches

Commerciol
Lots
Loke Prooerties 
Approisols

Johnny Childress - Broker

—

Christmas Early!

Money doesn’t grow on 
trees. It would be nice if 
it did, especially at 
Christmas time.

The only way you’ll find 
money for holiday 
shopping is a convenient 
loan.

Let Ozona National help 
you do the Christmas 
shopping you want to do 
—  today.

Come by today and let us 
fill your stocking this 
year. No fuss, no wait.

O zona N ational Bank
O Z O N A .T E X A S  76943Since 1905 Member FDIC

PHONE 392-2676. 392-2694, 392-3787 
MAIN BANK • 9 to 12 and 1 to 3 MOTOR BANK - 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.


