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Kitty’s K orner
by

Kitty Montgomery

Shades of the dark ages-- 
we never had sat down and 
really thought about the pro­
gress made with electricity 
the last 100 years until we 
were without it for over an 
hour Tuesday morning be­
fore the deadline. Before 
going completely off, it cut 
out a couple of times, losing 
the lines stored in the com­
puter type-setter. After it 
was off for about ten min­
utes, we decided to make up 
some last minute ads we had 
already set type for. 
Wouldn’t you know it, our 
waxer, run by electricity, was 
completely frozen, leaving us 
no way to get the type to 
adhere to the grid sheet.

I decided I would just write 
my stuff on a manual type­
writer. It was several min­
utes of browsing around 
before I realized we had not 
owned a manual typewriter 
in years. Oh well, I would 
just write my copy in long- 
hand. Would you believe it; 
the electric pencil sharpen­
er wouldn’t work. After this I 
decided to just sit down and 
have a cup of coffee. How­
ever, the electricity had been 
off so long, the coffee was 
cold, so that was the end of 
that.

A new cold spell blew in 
Tuesday morning and al­
though we have a gas fur­
nace, the fan is electric, so it 
got pretty cold before we 
realized the gas heat was not 
going to operate without 
electricity.

I don’t know what the 
problem was. The wind blew 
some before the lights went 
out, so that’s a possibility. It 
looks like the utility com­
pany is going the way of the 
phone company. The higher 
the cost, the lower the ser­
vice. We can manage with­
out the phone, but a power 
outage on Tuesday is just 
unthinkable and these come 
too often lately. Not on 
Tuesday, of course, but be­
cause this happened on 
Tuesday when we were using 
everything electrical it 
seemed more awful than us­
ual, and we feel something 
should be done to prevent 
these consistent power cut­
offs. We don’t even get 
an explanation anymore. It’s 
either a squirrel in a trans­
former or a tree limb or truck 
pulling a line down. Seems to 
us the company should have 
a better way to prevent this 
inconvenience. They don’t 
even knock off some on your 
bill for the inconvenience.

Mr. Vela  
Services

Funeral services for Ro- 
mulo L. Vela, 52, were held 
Tuesday at 4 p.m. in Our 
Lady of Perpetual Help Cath­
olic Church, with burial in 
Lima Cemetery.

Mr. Vela died at 10:30 
p.m. Saturday, in Crockett 
County Hospital.

Mr. Vela was born Dec. 
30, 1930 in Ozona. He was 
married to Chona Martinez 
Nov. 14, 1954 in Ozona. He 
was a noted bootmaker and 
had a shop at his home. He 
was also a marketing man­
ager at Jim’s Foodway. He 
was a veteran of the Korean 
War and a member of the 
Catholic Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
of Ozona; two daughters, 
Mrs. Hector DeHoyos, Jr. 
and Mrs. Kim John Tam- 
bunga, both of Ozona; one 
son, Fernando Vela of Fort 
Worth; one sister, Mrs. Luis 
Martinez of Ozona; one bro­
ther, Andres Vela of Fort 
Worth and four grandchild­
ren.

VARIOUS HONORS WERE BESTOWED on this group at Geniece Childress was named Citizen of the Year. Others 
the 19th Annual Chamber of Commerce Banquet held here honored were Dale Hobson, Jene Wilton, Jr. and Dee 
Thursday evening at the Civic Center. From left to right: Keiiers. [See story for details] [Photo by Jene Wilton, Jr.]

At Annual C of C Banquet-

Citizen of the year 
award to Mrs. Childress

The 19th Annual Chamber 
of Commerce Banquet was 
held at the Civic Center 
Thursday evening with 180 
persons in attendance. The 
Citizen of the Year Award 
went to Geniece Childress. 
The Young Citizen’s Award 
went to Jene Wilton, Jr. and 
the Flunky of the Year Award 
to Dee Keiiers. The Ozona 
Womans Forum was recog­
nized as the Organization of 
the Year, and special recog­
nition was given to Dale 
Hobson for the July 4, fire­
works display.

Mrs. Childress was chosen 
for her work in civic affairs, 
church and Historical Socie­
ty, plus her steady support of 
^ A ,  4-H and FFA. She has 
been active in the Sunday 
school department of First 
Baptist Church for 20 years. 
She was instrumental in pub­
lishing the Crockett County 
History Book and is present­
ly president of the Crockett 
County Museum.

Young Wilton is a senior in 
Ozona High School where he 
plays feature trumpet in the 
OHS band. He is active in 
First Baptist Youth Group 
and a member of the Ozona 
Volunteer Fire Department. 
He is an assistant scout­
master and head photogra­
pher for the school. He has 
attained the Order of the 
Arrow, the highest honor in 
Boy Scouting.

Hobson has been in the 
electric and plumbing busi­
ness in Ozona for the past 
five years. He recently open­
ed a grocery store and will 
soon open a restaurant here. 
He made a substantial dona­
tion to the Chamber of 
Commerce fireworks display 
July 4, besides attending to 
the lighting of the fireworks 
for the display.

The Womans Forum 
marks its 50th year of com­
munity service this year. 
Through the years it has 
made many civic improve­
ments through volunteer ef­
forts. Involvement in the 
community and support of all 
civic endeavors has been the 
interest of the club since its 
inception. The crimestopper 
program is its most recent 
contribution to the commu­
nity. Mrs. Huey Ingram ac­
cepted the award for the 
club.

Dee Keiiers was selected

for the new Flunkey of the 
Year award for his ongoing 
service to the community and 
individuals. One of the new 
directors, Johnny Childress, 
composed and read a clever 
poem acclaiming Dee’s 
praises. It is printed else­
where in this paper.

Mrs. Childress was pre­
sented an engraved plaque 
and the other awards were 
scrolls.

Steve Cannon won the 
hunting knife in the drawing. 
The contest was conducted 
by the Chamber of Com­
merce during hunting sea­
son. George Bijones, Marie 
Pearson and Lucille Harrell 
won the car seat covers 
donated by JW Motor Parts.

After the invocation by 
Clenton Eastman, pastor of

Calvary Baptist Church, the 
dinner was served.

Dr. Steve Sessbm, recent­
ly re-elected to the post of 
president, made the welcome 
address and introduced the 
outgoing directors, Becky 
Childress, Charles Size­
more, Don Sessom and Ron­
ald Shaw.

New directors were intro­
duced. They are Frank White 
of Ozona National Bank, Stan 
Lambert of the Crockett 
County National Bank, John­
ny Childress, realtor, and 
Gene Lilly of Lilly Construc­
tion Co.

Sessom expressed appre­
ciation to all who contribu­
ted to the success of this 
year’s banquet, KRCT and 
the Ozona Stockman for pub­
licity, Maxine’s for the floral

Hepatitis case 
suspected here

There is a suspected case 
of hepatitis in the Crockett 
County Hospital, according 
to Dr. R. M. Owensby, 
County Health officer.

The victim is a high school 
girl athlete, and the illness 
has caused some concern. 
However, Dr. Owensby as­
sured those who came in 
contact with her, need have 
no fear of contacting the di­
sease through drinking fi-om 
the same bottle as the sus­
pected type A virus is not 
transmitted through saliva.

Members of the imme­
diate family have been given 
gamma gobulin shots, but it 
is not necessary for others to

have the shots according to 
Dr. Owensby. He was in 
contact with the State Board 
of Health director of immu­
nology and was informed the

only precautions that need be 
taken are that of washing the 
hands before eating, and 
thoroughly washing the 
hands after use of the toilet.

Dr. Owensby said tests are 
not yet conclusive and that 
all tests results have not 
been recieved, but the sus­
pect virus is the type A, 
which cannot be transmitted

through oral contact. He also 
said he would notify the 
Stockman as the case pro­
gressed.

Woman
trapped

An Ozona woman was 
trapped in a wrecked car 
here Thursday morning for 
over half an hour before 
being rescued with the Jaws 
of Life, manned by Ozona 
firemen.

Iva Faye Macon, 56, was a 
passenger in a compact car 
driven by John Hollings­
worth and traveling east on 
Hwy 290 just outside the city 
limits of Ozona, at 10:30 a.m. 
when the car ran off the road 
on the right side, the driver 
over-corrected and the small 
car careened back across the 
highway rolled over and hit a 
tree before coming to rest on 
its top side.

Mrs. Macon was pinned in 
the car by the motor. After 
she was fireed from the 
wreckage, she was taken to 
Crockett County Hospital 
suffering a compound frac­
ture of the left leg, num­
erous lacerations and bruis­
es. She was hospitalized and 
Hollingsworth was treated 
for minor injuries.

Lions routed by 
Ballinger 78-49

arrangements, Peggy Well­
man and the Myrtle Post 
Garden Club for table decor­
ations, Boy Scout Troop 153 
for setting up and arranging 
the tables.

Sessom gave a report on 
the chamber’s activities dur­
ing the past year, beginning 
with the April Easter Egg 
Hunt when several hundred 
children participated. Candy 
eggs numbered 2,500 and 
there were 24 prize eggs. 
Also, the annual tennis tour­
nament the past summer and 
the church in the park pro­
ject also sponsored by the 
chamber. The fireworks dis­
play saw one of the largest 
crowds in Ozona history gat­
hered to eat watermelon and 
view the fireworks. And the 
successful participation by 
the chamber in the youth 
rodeo, plus the Halloween 
carnival in which 13 organi­
zations took part and took in 
a total of $1,989. The year’s 
projects ended with the tur­
key shoot in November. Ses­
som thanked all those who 
took part in the conclusion of 
the year’s successful pro­
jects.

A preview of the coming 
year’s projects was given, 
beginning with sponsorship 
of the blood bank, Feb. 9, the 
Easter Egg Hunt, April 2; 
the mile run May 21; the 
tennis tournament in June, 
Church in the park and the 
fireworks display in July, the 
junior rodeo August 5-6, an 
art show in September, the 
Halloween Carnival in Octo­
ber and the turkey shoot in 
November.

The annual banquet wiff be 
held in January of 1984 to 
mark the 20th year of the 
organization of the chamber 
of commerce. Members now 
number 137. New members 
this year include R. B. Bab­
bitt, Donuts, Etc., Spencer 
Welding, Whitehouse Co., 
De La Rosa Plumbing, Crock­
ett Hotel, Moore Oil, Eliza­
beth Upham Ins., Strata Well 
Service, Double T Ranch and 
the Flower Basket.

Sessom introduced the out 
of town guests before turning 
the program over to the 
guest speaker. Col. Ben F. 
Swank, Jr. Out of town 
guests included Bob Die- 
bitsch, Evelyn Diebitsch and 
Kay Kisor of San Angelo, 
and Maurine and Mike 
Werst of Big Lake.

By-Ross Alexander
In a game marred by 

sloppy ball handling and 
poor offensive production, 
the Ozona Lions fell out of 
contention for first place hon­
ors for the 1st half of district 
play Friday night, as Bal­
linger soundly thrashed out a 
78-49 victory, improving 
their record to 2-2, while 
Ozona slips to 1-3.

The game stats indicate 
clearly that the competitive 
matchups which produced 
such an exciting and close 
game between these two 
teams earlier this season in 
Sonora just were not there, 
as the potent Ozona offen­
sive punch failed to mater­
ialize. The Lions hit on a 
miserable 16 of 58 shots from 
the field, and in the second 
half, only 8 of 33 from the 
floor...by far the most inad­
equate offensive production 
of the season.

“ We shot poorly, and 
turned the ball over too often 
and the result was a rout, 
simple as that,’’ an exas­
perated Coach John Curry 
said afterwards. “ We 
seemed to come out for the 
first 2 or 3 minutes pretty 
good, but they went into a 
zone and we went flat at that 
point. We didn’t handle their 
press very well at all.’’

Ozona managed 42 re­
bounds but suffered 41 turn­
overs in 84 total posses­
sions, although Ballinger had 
49 turnovers in 79 total 
possessions.

The inconsistency the 
Lions seem to be strugg­
ling with this season can be 
seen in the performance of 
Robert Massey who drew the 
tough Aaron Keesee defen­
sively. During the first quar­
ter of play, Massey simply 
outplayed the high scoring 
Keesee, holding him to just 3 
points while scoring 4 for the 
Lions himself. In the later 
going, however, particularly 
third period action, Keesee 
went to the hoop with deadly 
frequency, while Massey’s 
attempts from the floor sub­
sided considerably. Dan

Bean had trouble with Bal­
linger’s Halfmann whose 19 
points, mostly off-the-boards 
type baskets made from in­
side, hurt the Lions’ hopes of 
mounting any comeback ef­
fort. Gary Whitehead had 
difficulty at times with Bal­
linger’s Manley whose 15 
points were not matched by 
Gary’s 2 points.

“ A team that doesn’t have 
a lot of basketball saavy 
tends to be rather inconsis­
tent,’’ Coach Curry candid­
ly stated recently. “ We had 
just played a close tough 
game last week against Col­
orado City, and whether or 
not we expended ourselves 
somewhat emotionally dur­
ing that game. I’d be re­
luctant to speculate on. One 
thing, however, is undenia­
ble... we were fiat against 
Ballinger Friday night.’’

When Ozona scores only 
49 points in a contest. Coach 
Curry needs someone to rise 
to the leadership spot, pro­
vide the consistently strong

Services here

offensive performance and 
display an efficient field goal 
percentage in the process. 
Maybe in this upcoming 
second half of the district 
season, we will see some real 
offensive leadership develop 
in this kid Sanchez, and get a 
glimpse of the true dimen­
sions of his game.

“ We are very much in the’ 
running for a post season 
playoff spot as the second 
half commences,’’ Coach 
Curry insisted. “ Each team 
has an equal chance because 
each must play the other at 
least once again. I’ll admit 
that we are at the low point of 
our season, but there is 
absolutely nothing that indi-- 
cates that we can’t turn this* 
season completely around 
and win the 2nd half.

Coahoma comes to David­
son Memorial Gymnasium 
this Friday night, and Ozona 
can get the 2nd half off to a 
successful start right here at 
the Bulldogs’ expense.

today 
for Elizabeth Perner

Funeral services for Eliz­
abeth (Lizzie) Perner, 93, will 
be held this afternoon, Wed­
nesday, Feb. 2, at 2:30 
o’clock in Ozona United 
Methodist Church, with bur­
ial to follow in Cedar Hill 
Cemetery.

Mrs. Perner died at 6:15 
a.m. Monday in Shannon 
Hospital in San Angelo.

She was born Elizabeth 
Odom, the youngest daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. J. W. 
Odom, September 7, 1889, in 
Callahan County. She moved 
with her parents to Ozona 
when she was two years of 
age. She was married to Paul 
C. Perner Sept. 7, 1909 in 
Ozona. She was an active 
member of the Methodist 
Church, teaching in the 
Youth Department for 22 
years. She was a member of 
the Eastern Star, Ozona Wo­
mans Club, Ozona Garden

Club and the Music Club.
She is survived by three 

daughters, Pauline Mont­
gomery of Ozona, Elizabeth 
Wilson of Odessa, and Mary 
Daniels of Atlanta, Ga.; one 
son, P.C. Perner of El Paso; 
one brother, William Odom 
of Kingsland; seven grand­
children and nine great 
grandchildren.

immunization 
clinic set

Public Health Nurses will 
conduct an Immunization 
Clinic Thursday February 3, 
at the Civic Center, 10 a.m.- 
12:00 noon and 1-2:00 p.m.

All children and students 
can get free immunizations 
against dangerous childhood 
diseases. Nurses keep a rec­
ord for each child and will tell 
parents what shots are need­
ed.

COUNTY AGENT HONORED-Debra Price, Home Demonstration Agent here for the past 
ten years, was honored with a reception in the newly restored offices at the conrthonse here 
Friday a^m oon . Debra and her husband, Bill, have moved to Qnannah. She shows the 
brass tray presented to her by the Extension office. Nancy Hale, secretary and BUly Reagor, 
county agent pose with Mrs. Price.
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FROM THE HERITAGE FOUNDATION WASHINGTON, D C.

UNCERTAIN FOREIGN 
POLICY
By Edwin Feulner

Though there have been noticeable changes in the 
character and handling of U.S. foreign policy in the few 
months that George Shultz has been at the State 
Department’s helm, the American ship of state still sails 
on troubled water.

There is movement in the right direction. The President 
has all the right instincts, if left to himself. But that’s not 
the way things work in the nation’s capital, as the “ Let 
Reagan-Be Re^^gan’’ buttons that continue to adorn the 
clothing “of Washington conservatives will attest; the 
Presidei^ ha|̂  ̂thither th^ last word, nor the only word, 
about anything—not even within his own administration.

Thus, we find government changing course on a daily 
basis, not necessarily because conditions have changed, but 
because the internal tuggings-and-pullings within the 
bureaucracy lead to ebbs and flows of power. Though 
they’re not all visible, there are literally thousands of 
branch chiefs, section chiefs, division chiefs, assistant 
secretaries, under secretaries, and deputy assistant 
secretaries, commissioners, and bureaucratic 
“ supergrades’’ trying to get their way on policy matters. 
An administration often is dragged along, not necessarily 
against its will, but because nobody realizes the shifts are 
taking place until they become “ fait accompli.’’

The results make for good newspaper copy, but not 
good policy. As Middle East expert James Phillips pointed 
out during the mid-December Washington visit of Pakistani 
President Zia ul-Haq, “ Since the United States began 
arming Pakistan in 1954, it has adopted eight different arms 
policies for South Asia, a record that is not likely to inspire 
confidence.’’ The eight shifts coincide with only five 
presidencies.

While nobody would argue for a rigid foreign policy, 
there are great dangers in having one that by appearance 
or reality lacks direction. Yet, that has been the hallmark 
of U.S. international dealings for many years now.

Maj. Gen. Henry Mohr (U.S. Army-Ret.) asks in a 
savvy essay in the St. Louis Globe-Democrat: “ Does 
anybody really know what is U.S. foreign policy toward 
Cuba? Or Communist Nicaragua? Or Red China? Or 
Taiwan? Or South Africa and all of southern and central 
Africa?’’ Indeed.

“ Can anyone say what would actually happen—what 
the United States would really do— if any country where 
U.S. interests are involved (outside NATO) were attacked, 
or attack appeared imminent?’’ How about Israel. Do the 
Israelis really have any reason to believe the United States 
would be there to prevent their national annihilation if push 
came to shove?

Of course, a certain amount of uncertainty is good.
“ For example,’’ General Mohr says, “ the Russians 

aren’t too sure that we won’t use nuclear weapons against 
them if they try to swarm over Europe with superior 
numbers of tanks, artillery and troops. And the Russians 
aren’t too certain about what the United States might do 
if they move to seize some coveted objectives in the Persian 
Gulf-Middle East region either. ’’

But neither, I suspect, do we ourselves know.
(Feulner is president of The Heritage Foundation, a 

Washington-based public policy research institute.)

The Colonel’s Pipe Shop
in San Angelo
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Phone 944-3322 Moil Order Service

S T A T E  C A P I T A L

HIGHLIGHTS
By Lyndell Williams

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

AUSTIN—Political smiles 
and handshakes were out 
front last week when two 
presidential hopefuls visited 
Texas looking for support.

Behind the scenes, Texas 
legislators went quietly 
about the business of getting 
through the winding battle 
over gubernatorial appoint­
ments.

Former Vice President 
Walter Mondale flew Thurs­
day to San Antonio, meeting 
with South Texas business 
and political Democrats and 
picking up presidential en­
dorsements, including that 
city's Mayor Henry Cisneros. 
One source who attended 
closed meetings reported 
Mondale had “locked up” 
the city's support. Others 
mentioned Cisneros as a vice 
presidential possibility.

Meanwhile, former astro­
naut Ohio Senator John 
Glenn paid his second visit 
to Texas in three weeks, ad­
dressing a joint session of the 
Legislature and showcasing 
the endorsement of Lt. Gov. 
Bill Hobby. Hobby's support 
helps Glenn in Houston, and, 
insiders say, boosts Texas 
Sen. Lloyd Bentsen’s chances 
for the vice president slot.

Glenn, who was the first 
American to orbit the Earth, 
told legislators “the full 
blown tragedy” of the U.S. 
economy was now the fault 
of Reaganomics.

“Down in Flames”
Texas Gov. Mark White 

remained neutral in the presi­
dential sweepstakes, and also 
on the dispute in the Senate 
whether to confirm or "bust” 
Texas Supreme Court Justice 
Jack Pope.

Pope, a Democrat and 
highly respected jurist, was 
appointed by former Gov. 
Bill Clements shortly after 
Clements’ defeat and over 
the objections of 14 senators. 
Those senators now want to 
“bust” Pope and let White 
pick his replacement, which 
many of them hope will be 
former Atty. Gen. John 
White.

Those senators wouldn’t 
mind confirming Pope if he 
would publically commit to 
retiring before his term ends 
in two years so that White 
may pick his successor.

The 69-year-old Pope,

who retired once from his 
Associate Justice seat, re­
fused to make deals. “Win or 
lose, the independence of the 
judiciary from politics needs 
to be re-established,” he said.

“If I go out, I'm gonna go 
down in flames,” Pope said.

Elected Utilities?
White said he will ask the 

Legislature to pass a law al­
lowing Texans to elect mem­
bers to the Public Utility 
Commission. He apparently
will seek at-large elections of 
commission members who 
currently arc appointed by 
him.

He also appointed an Aus­
tin lawyer, Rafael Quintanil­
la, as head of the Texas 
Department of Community 
Affairs. Quintanilla in 1978 
took over Gov, Dolph Bris­
coe's troubled migrant affairs 
office, ironing out prior mis­
managements and winning 
respect for his administra­
tive skills.

The Attorney General
New Atty. Gen. Jim Mat­

tox  ̂ never one’to shy‘away^ 
from controversial issues, an­
nounced he will issue an 
opinion soon on whether 
three Tarrant County jus­
tices of the peace can legally 
refuse to perform interracial 
marriages.

Texas law at one time pro­
vided criminal penalties for 
interracial marriages, but a 
1966 U..S. Supreme Court 
ruling struck down all such 
state laws.

Mattox also said a Feb. 12 
special election involving 
Democrat-turned-Republican 
Phil Gramm may be illegal 
becau.se it does not give 
Democrats enough time to 
prepare. A lawsuit has been 
filed to delay the election, 
and Gov. White has been 
approached to change the 
election date .set by former 
Gov. Clements before he 
left office last three weeks 
ago.

Any delay is believed to 
help leading Democrat con­
tender Dan Kubiak and nine 
other challengers overtake 
Gramm.

The Senate
The Senate gave prelimi­

nary approval to legislation

The Newsreel
A re-run of “The Ozona Story" as gleaned from 
the Files of the “ The Ozona Stockman"

banning "lame duck” ap­
pointments, and is expected 
to send the measure to the 
House sometimes this week.

The Senate also passed 
bills to force parents to put 
their small children in car 
safety seats and to let judges 
continue to lock up mental 
patients on an emergency 
basis.

The car seat bill provides 
a S50 ticket to parents who 
don't safety seat their chil­
dren under age four. The 
ticket can be dismissed if 
parents buy a car scat within 
10 days of violation.

The House
In the House, ,Speaker Gib 

Lewis of Fort Worth said he 
wants to avoid considering 
the controversial issue of 
congressional redistricting 
because it divides legislators.

But Lewis did support a 
plan to increase Texas auto­
mobile license fees by as 
much as $500 million a year 
for highways.

, The plan would base the 
fees on a car’s value, rather 
th^n its weight. That would 
mcan"" a' ne^ %f0,000 ^ a f  
weighing 4,000 pounds 
would jump fees from 
$25.50 to $156. a year.

A bizzarre accident occur­
red last week wnen new 
Speaker Pro Tern Hugo 
Berlanga of Fort Worth 
filled in at the podium for 
his first time. The gavel head 
flew off its handle and hit 
Rep. Anita Hill, R-Garland, 
in the head.

Ironically, Mrs. Hill had 
just walked up to the podium 
to kid with Berlanga about 
a supposedly male chauvinist 
comment. As she walked 
away, the flying gavel caught 
her about 12 feet away. A 
stunned Berlanga was later 
kidded by legislators, especi­
ally Republicans who said 
they have “too few on the 
floor already.”

flinrsday, Feb. 4, 1954
Mrs. J. A. Pelto was 

honored at a layette shower 
Saturday afternoon at the 
North Elementary audi­
torium.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Country Club’s 

March of Dimes day Sunday 
netted the local polio drive 
$257. A total of 75 members 
and guests played golf and 
other games during the day, 
all proceeds going to the 
March of Dimes drive.

29 yrs. ago
Miss Patricia Hickman, 

daughter of Rev. and Mrs. 
Troy Hickman, whose mar­
riage to Sherman L. Piepler 
of Coleraine, Minn., will take 
place Friday evening, Feb. 5, 
in Coleraine, was honored at 
a gift tea Monday afternoon 
in the home of Mrs. S. M. 
Harvick.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Literary Club will 

stage its annual bake sale at 
the Ratliff Hdw. & Frn. Co. 
store Saturday, Feb. 13, 
starting at 10 o’clock in the 
morning.

29 yrs. ago
Col. Tommy Laxson, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Laxson of 
Ozona, is attending the 4th 
Infantry Division artillery 
NCO academy at Hanan, 
Germany. Tommy has been 
in the army 13 months.

29 yrs. ago
Crockett County ranchmen 

were reminded this week by 
Mrs. Mary Dunlap, execu­
tive officer in the local ASC 
office, that before any 1954 
practice can be started under 
the ASC program prior ap­

proval must be obtained from 
her office. A limit of $4(X) per 
operator has been set by the 
county committee as the 
maximum which can be earn­
ed this year and operators 
will be allocated the funds as 
long as the county’s allot­
ment lasts.

29 yrs. ago
Howard Lemmons son of 

Mrs. Ben Lemmons of Ozona 
and a resident of Ozona since 
1928, this week announced 
his candidacy for the office of 
county attorney of Crockett 
county subject to the Demo­
cratic primary this summer.

29 yrs. ago
Beauty will be added to the 

already beautiful Ozona 
swimming pools and patrons 
of the city’s two pools will 
enjoy a new look when this 
year’s swimming season rolls 
around, thanks to the efforts 
of the Ozona Literary Club. 
The club has placed an order 
for a total of 52 trees and 
shrubs which will be used in 
landscaping the grounds and 
surrounding areas of the two 
pools.

29 yrs. ago
Ralph H. Carden of Ozona 

was among 49 cadets and 
midshipmen commissioned 
by University of Texas ROTC 
units in exercises at the 
University last Friday and 
Saturday.

29 yrs. ago
Major H. A. Gustavus 

spent a couple of days here 
this week with his family 
enroute to a new assignment 
at Craig AFB in Selma, Ala.

L in E R S  TO THE EDITOR

Many merchants are im­
proving their business by 
advertising in newspapers.

February 1,1983
Dear Editor;

In reading the Stockman 
lately you might be mislead 
that everything is fine at the 
hospital. I for one know that 
this is not true.

Years ago, when I started 
out in business, one of the 
toughest problems I had was 
to acquire a complete tOoL 
box. Slowly, as the need 
arose, my objective was^W 
have the best. It would have 
been a lot easier if someone 
would have given me a four 
(4) million dollar tool box and 
said, “ get after it.’’

The point being this, for 
weeks I have read letters to 
the editor about our medical 
tool box or hospital if you 
please. How could we lose 
$722,OCX) dollars this year of 
county money and not had 
any improvements to our 
hospital? The only way to use 
up a tool box is to exploit the 
giver of the box. We have sat 
here year after year and 
watched our hospital be used 
and abused by the Pros who 
have only one thought in 
mind “ let me get mine 
first.’’

We have seen people over­
medicated, over-exploited 
and outrageously conned to 
the tune of V* of a million 
dollars of the taxpayers’ 
money. If charity starts at 
home, so does disgrace. We 
hear of $2,500 bills for 3 days 
care for the flu. We see a 
whole generation not being 
born at our hospital, yet we 
are assured by the educated 
expertise that this has to be

because our tool box is not 
complete.

Now a great percentage of 
us have had the flu and 
almost all of us have been 
born. Seems like the absurd 
is being dealt with and the 
common let go. When we ask 
how we can have better 
medical care for our people, 
the ^expert says, “ a new tool 
box, a new hospital, a new 
thiyailidiietter.that and fhen 
we can do the common 
things.’’ But this is not the 
case-wC are always short 
something. I think the short­
age is in the so-called expert. 
Without changing our stan­
dards we must ask for some 
consideration that does not 
border on the absurd.

The problems are not only 
in our county. This is a 
national problem, too. Un­
less there is some court in 
our nation or board in our 
county to tell the experts to 
stop playing games there will 
never be enough money or 
wisdom to bail us out.

Money is not the problem 
nor the solution. In my 
opinion, the solution rests on 
the professionals! What we 
need are doctors willing to 
take responsibility, practice 
good common sense medi­
cine and clean up their own 
act.

Gene Lilly

"Opinion is ultimately de­
termined by the feelings, 
and not by the intellect."

I Herbert Spencer

TEIE STATE OF TEXAS,

County of CROCKETT

Crockett County Consolidated Common School District No.

It is hereby ordered, and notice is hereby given, that there will be held an election on Saturday, the

2__ April, A. D. Crockett County Courthouse , Absentee at County_____

Clerks Office (Daily 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM)

in Crockett County Con. Common School District No. 1 for the purpose of electing

\------- Trustee-^ for said School District, in said County, to serve for the ensuing term.

The polls at said election shall be opened at 2__ o’clock A. M. and shall not be closed before

7 o’clock P. M.

OzonaBy order of the Board of Trustees of said School District at _ 

i n ------------------___________________  County, Texas, this _̂_12 ^

A . D . 19- 83

Board of Trustees, 1 Crockett County Consolidated Common School District No.

Crockett County, Texas.

• ̂  ~  ̂ 0*-
P residen t.

Ozona 
Business

And 

Professional 
Guide

OZONA DAY 
CARE CENTER 

Methodist Church 
PHONE 392-3641 
BIRTH TO 13 YRS. 
fulltime or drop-in 
7:45 a.m. to 6 p.m.

WELDING 
General & Oilfield 

24 Hr. Service 
Ph. 392-3029

VILLAGE BARBER SHOP 
Regular Haircuts 

Razor Cuts-Layer Cuts 
and Men’s Hair Styling 

Jim Caldwell

WHITEHOUSE CO. 
GULF PRODUCTS 
punting Supplies 

Deer Leases
Ph. 392-3912, 705-11th St, 

6:00 a.m.-10:00 p.m.

MAXINE’S 
FLOWER SHOP 

Fresh Cut-Pot Plants 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

CAMERAS TWO 
Photography and 

Frame Shop 
404 Ave. J 
392-2256

VFW POST 6109 
Regular Meetings 

Third Tuesday 
In Each Month 

8 P.M.

OZONA BUTANE CO. 
Propane Gas 

Sales and Service 
1108 Ave. E 
Ph. 392-3013

THE LINE ^  
Party Merchants^ 
14Mi.EoffI-10 

Beer-Liquor-Wine 
Ph. 387-2956

THE BAGGETT AGENCY 
Insurance 

Your Protection 
is our Profession 

1114 Ave. E-392-2606

‘Everything for the Home’ 
at

BROWN FURNITURE CO. 
906 Ave. E 

Ph. 392-2341

J.W. MOTOR PARTS 

Auto Parts & Supplies
606 nth St.

392-2343

FIRST BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Dr. S.N. Lanham, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 
Evening Worship 7:00 
Prayer Service Wed.7;30

WANTED 
ALL SINGLES 

18 and up-to attend 
the growing Singles Class 

First Baptist Church 
Sunday 9:45 A.M.

ROYAL AMBASSADORS 
[Scouting Program] 

Boys 1st-12th grades 
Each Wednesday at 6 p.m 

First Baptist Church

SKAIN’S GARAGE 
Welding & General Repair 

24 Hr. Wrecker Service
392-3110 392-3505

MARY KAYE 
COSMETICS 
Ruth Hester 
Ph. 392-2051 
205 Ave. J

38-tfc

SPORT SHACK 
T-Shirts-Transfers 

Deer Leases 
1102 Ave. 1392-3382

B&C AUTOMOTIVE 
Complete Auto Repair 

& Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 
403-lst Street
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JIM 'S
FO O D W A Y

H e a r t y  B e e f  S te w
Winter time meals are times for the hearty stews, 
soups and casseroles with hot breads. One of my 
favorites is this savory beef stew with lots of hot 
rolls and butter ...
^  Savory Oven Beef StewI 2 lb. Chuck Roast 
I V* tsp. pepper 
I 1 tsp. salt 
• V4 c. flour 
I 2 bay leaves

1 ( l5oz.) can tomato 
sauce

1 ( l6oz.) can tomatoes 
4 med. carrots, sliced 
1 (lOoz.) pkgf. frozen

I 2 med. onions, peeled peas 
I &  quartered 2 med. potatoes, peeled
I 1 c. shced celery and cubed
I 2 c. water
I Combine flour, salt and pepper. Dredge meat in 
i flour. Brown in small amount of hot fat. Add 
I remaining ingredients. Cover and bake in 300°
I oven for 2 V2 to 3 hours. Remove bay leaves, ad- 
I just seasoning if necessary. Cut meat into small 
I pieces. Thicken with small amount of flo\ir if 
I desired. Serves 6 . J

CAROL SCROGGINS 
DIRECTOR OF CONSUMER AFFAIRS

Carol Scroggins
Director Of Consumer Affairs
RO. Box 33160
San Antonio, TX 78233

Y o u  c a n ' t  
b u y  b e t t e r ,

P R IC ES  EFFEC T IV E  
TH U R SD A Y. FEB. 3rd 
thru MONDAY, FEB. 7th

LIM IT RIGH TS  
R ESER V ED

SMOKED-FULLY COOKED

BONELESS 
IMAMS

MEAT or BEEF

BOOB VALUE 
FBANKS

.89
USDA CHOICE “ P.S.”  BEEF

O C H U C K  BOAST
12-OZ 
PKG

Sunday House

SMOKEO TURKEYS LB
GOOD VA LU E-A SSO R TEDSLICED MEATS
U SD A  CH O ICE "P.S. " B EEFCHUCK STEAK

W A FER 2y2-OZ 
THIN PKG

B O N ELESS

$ |3 9

.49
$ |6 9

PERSONALLT
SELECTED

FRESH & LEAN 
CHUCK QUALITY

GROUND 
BEEF

LEAN & TENDER

B E E F  S K IR T S

FAJITAS $159
L B . J |

CUT

iGREEN 
BEANS

15'/2-0Z
CANS

“ MIX ’EM or MATCH ’EM”

I CANNED
VEGETABLES

CORF

$
•CKFAM STYLE or WHOLE KERNEL CORN 
•SLICED or 
WHOLE BEETS 

• "LOW SODIUM"
SLICED BEETS 
CUT or
FRENCH SLICED 
GREEN BEANS

•SHREDDED | I 1 0 .0 2
CANSSAUERKRAUT

"NIX ’EH or HXTGH ’EH”
©  CANNED 
VEGETABLES

$
"LOW SODIUM" 
•PEAS
•MIXED VEGS. 
•WHOLE KERNEL 
CORN

•CARROTS-REG. 
•CARROTS 
•WHOLE PEELED 
TOMATOES 16-OZ

CANS

GOOD VALUE DINNERS

MACARONI 
AND CHEESE

5 ^BOXES M

A u r o r aBATHROOM TISSUE
D EL M ONTEPINEAPPLE ORANGE DRINKS

4-RO LL
PKG

46-OZ
CAN

99«
89«

GLADIOLA

FLOUR
VAN CAMPS 

W e s t e r n  S t y le

BEANS 15^2 OZ. CAN
3/»l 00

Z E S T ASaltines 1 LB. BOX 7 9
GOOD VALUE

SUGAR

GOOD VALUEBarbecue Sauce 18 OZ. 
BOTTLE

4 3 0

DEL MONTE
Tomato $  -1 
Catsup 44 0Z.JAK ■

59

G A L A

TOWELS 69
LG. ROLL

DEL MONTE

PEAR u OZ.
HALVES CAN 59

Good Value Fluoride

Toothpaste
Good Value

Deodorant

6.4-DZ
TUBE

YDUR CHDICE: 
2%-Dz. Stick 
3-Dz. Roll-Dn

Good Value Balsam Protein

•Regular BTL

EXTRA LARGE WASHINGTON

Conditioner
Good Value Balsam Protein

Shampoo

$109

.89

.9 9

.99
FRBZEN 1

iS  BRANGE J 
^  JUICE J

r  2“69
J FIELDS GRADE “ A”

jL '  ’" LARBE 
EGGS

%.69
GANDY’SIce Cream

‘/a GAL.

GANDY’SButtermilk $ 2̂9
‘/2 GAL. CTN.

GANDY’S

Ice Cream $4̂ ^
5 QT. BUCKET

GANDY’S

Cottage „„ $.<39 
Cheese 'MRS. SMITH-SUPERSPECIAL

^  ASST. FLAVORS  ̂  ̂”P |0 S  46 HZ. 4m

KRAFT AM ERICAN  4̂4 AQ
Cheese ■

FLEISCBMANN’S 100%

Corn Oil , , o z  .99
..... ............... . ""1

STORE HOURJ
9 1 6  ir-STREET OZONA I D A  7:30AM-6:30PMFRI-SAT.. . HOME OWNED 4 OPERATED CLOSED SUNDAY

UNITED
S U P E R S
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Extension office news Cub©tt©S brinQ  hom ©
Although unemployment 

means some change for fami­
lies, it doesn’t necessarily 
mean family disintegration.

Many people feel unem­
ployment has a severe neg­
ative impact on the individ­
ual and results in a family 
crisis. But this isn’t always 
true. Many families may 
draw closer together and use 
the opportunity for a more 
satisfactory job change or 
more flexible attitudes to­
ward home/work roles.

Studies of families that 
have adapted to crisis sit­
uations point out several 
ways to avoid additional 
stress.

Stressful situations are not 
viewed as unmanageable 
when families have reserves 
to draw on, either money put 
aside for an emergency or 
possible investment.

Education is a personal 
resource because it can help 
the person realistically look 
at unemployment and anal­
yze possible strategies for 
job change/relocations.

Another personal resource 
is health and emotional well­
being. When individuals are 
h ea lth y , psychological 
threats that often accompany 
job loss don’t affect them as 
much. Good health is also 
useful when looking for a 
new job.

When a family is close and 
adaptable, a person’s re­
sponse to unemployment is 
less severe.

Communication within the 
family unit is valuable. It 
enables discussion of manag

ing limited resources, em­
ployment alternatives and 
feelings of worth and recog­
nition.

The ability to shift roles is 
important: flexible attitudes 
toward job tasks at home and 
work make role changes eas­
ier to accept than structured 
“who does what’’ attitudes.

U nem ploym ent often  
brings families closer as they 
look for ways to compensate 
job and financial losses.

Social supports available 
to unemployed individuals 
and their families may be 
found in community services, 
federal and state assistance, 
company or union benefits 
and neighborhood or group 
networks. This assistance 
may be in the form of money, 
goods, services or self-help 
programs.

Although job loss is not 
always related to perfor­
mance, the unemployed per­
son often feels vulnerable. 
Social services reduce the se­
verity of this feeling.

Unemployment is part of 
the current economic situa­
tion, and so is the stress 
placed on the family of an 
unem ployed in d iv id u a l. 
Families can cope more ef­
fectively with adjust­
ments and change to fit the 
situation when they recog­
nize and use their availa­
ble resources.

consolation trophy
The 7th grade Cubettes 

traveled to Del Rio Friday 
and Saturday to compete in 
the Del Rio tournament. In 
the first game the Cubettes 
played Del Rio “A” and 
were defeated 21-14.

Sharon McCrohan had 7 
points, Lydia Pena, 5 points; 
Lacy Miller, 2 points. Lydia 
Pena was high rebounder 
with 12 rebounds.

Later the same day the 
Cubettes played Uvalde and 
this time came out on the 
winning side with a score of 
26-11. Sharon McCrohan had 
10 points, Lydia Pena, 6 
points; Eileen Moran, 4 po­
ints; Randi Thompson, 4; 
and Melissa Vallejo, 2 po­
ints. High rebounder was 
Lydia Pena with 12 rebounds 
and Julie Cantu had 2 as­
sists.

The following day the Cub­

ettes returned to Del Rio to 
play Sacred Heart Christian 
Academy for consolation. In 
a close game that was decid­
ed by free throws the Cub­
ettes won 19-16. Leading by 
one point with less than a 
minute to play Lydia Pena 
made both shots of a one and

Womans
L©agu© in

one.
Sharon McCrohan had 9 

points, 7 were free throws, 
Lydia Pena had 6 points; 4 
were free throws, and Eliz­
abeth Soto had 4 points. 
Sharon McCrohan had 15 
rebounds and Lydia Pena 
had 2 steals.

Overall the Cubettes had a 
good tournament bringing 
home a consolation trophy. 
The Cubettes have two more 
games before the track sea­
son begins.

Other members of the 
team are Olga Borrego, Mar­
tha Enriquez, Regina Cer- 
vantez. Dawn Hanson, Judy 
Flores, Sylvia Flores, and 
Ermelinda Mata. Stacie 
Winkley and Mendy Clay are 
this years managers.

m©©ting Mrs. Gillit

Mrs. Marley is 
hostess for

OZONA
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

110211th Ozona

Sunday Morning Class 
9:45

Sunday Morning Worship 
10:50

Sunday Evening Worship 
6:30

Wednesday Evening 
Class 
7:00

KRCT Radio Every 
3rd Month

RALPH ANDERSON 
Minister

Serving Christ By 
Serving You

bridge club
Mrs. J. J. Marley was 

hostess for bridge at the 
Ozona Country Club Thurs­
day.

High score went to Mrs. 
Sherman Taylor and second 
high to Mrs. Evart White. 
Mrs. Bill Mason won the club 
bingo and Mrs. Joe Couch 
the Charlotte Phillips bingo.

Others playing were Mrs. 
Clay Adams, Mrs. Charlie 
Black, Mrs. John Childress, 
Mrs. Gene Lilly, Mrs. Kirby 
Moore, Mrs. W. E. Friend, 
Mrs. J. B. Parker, Mrs. 
Buddy Phillips, Mrs. B. W. 
Stuart, Mrs. Charles Wil­
liams and Mrs. Jack Wil­
liams.

Ozona’s Womans League 
met January 25, in the home 
of Mr. Hillery Phillips with 
Mrs. Lane Scott and Mrs. 
Rick Hunnicutt serving as 
hostesses.

Mr. John Pounds with the 
San Angelo Police Depart­
ment’s Crime Prevention Di­
vision gave an “ eye open­
ing’’ lecture on “ How to say 
‘no, thank-you’ to rape.’’ 
His “ crash course’’ in fem­
inine self-defense gave a dif­
ferent view to so many of the 
old efforts made in this area.

Those present for one 
more lession in awareness to 
the menaces that surround 
us today were Mmes, Jerry 
Lay, Randy Crawford, Den­
nis Clark, Steve Kenley, Jack 
Probst, Bob Childress, Rick 
Webster, Pleas Childress III, 
David Bean, Roy Jackson, 
Steve Wilkins, Buster Dea­
ton, Douglas Moore, Dwight 
Childress, Fred Chandler, 
Bill Mason, Bobby Aycock, 
Pancho McMullan, John R. 
Hunnicutt and Billy Carson.

honored with 
gift tea
Mrs. Jimmy Gillit was 

honored with a gift tea 
Saturday, Jan. 29, from two 
until four o’clock at the 
Granny Miller Hall.

Hostesses were Mmes. 
Charles Farris, Rex Parker, 
Bobby Knox, Jamie Knox, 
Bill Dixon, Freddie Nicks, 
Weldon Nicks, Bill Crowder, 
Mike Preddy, Charles Pred- 
dy, Claude Montya, Willena 
Holden, Charles Huffman, 
George Olson, Jeff Owens, 
Larry Arledge, Bill Watson, 
Ruth Gilliam, Violet Allen, 
Cliff Williamson, C. O. 
Walker and J.B. Miller.

A special guest was Mrs. 
Serilda Senne, grandmother 
of the bridegroom.

Out of town guests includ­
ed Mrs. Maggie Glasscock, 
Mrs. Anna Rose Gillit and 
Miss Paula Gillit.

Around 40 guests called 
during the tea hours.

r w

IT'S HERE O ZO N A !

The Unique Dining Experience 
The Old Steak House is opening it's  doors to you

Monday, February 7

Come in and enjoy our pleasant atm osphere 
and delightful surroundings

MENU
■Chorbroil Steaks- 

•Homemade Bread- 
-Plate Lunchef- 

-Breakfast-
-Salad Bar-

Open Seven Days a Week
5:00  am. - 11:00 pm.

Owners:
Dale Hobson & Terry Lindsey Phone 392-3482

THE OLD STEAK HOUSE

Tips For Gardeners
From The Ozona Garden 
Club by Mrs. Bailey Post

This is the month of pre­
paration for outdoor plant­
ing:

“The February sunshine 
steeps your boughs and tints 
the buds and swells the 
leaves within.’’

William Cullen Bryan-
Don’t delay longer those 

tasks that could have been 
done in January and that 
must be done now if your 
garden is not to suffer.

The dividing and replant­
ing of perennials that are to 
be given this treatm ent 
should be done before new 
growth has made much head­
way.

Dormant sprays should be 
used now if this has been 
neglected.

Apply fertilizer to shrubs, 
trees and evergreens except 
azalean and camellias which 
should be done after they 
bloom.

Trees, shrubs and vines 
that are espaliered against 
walls may be pruned now if 
they are kinds that flower on 
new growth. If they produce 
their blossom on last year’s 
growth, delay pruning until 
after they have flowered.

Winter arrangements may 
be enjoyed made of spring­
flowering ornamentals, such 
as forsythia, flowering 
quince, plum, redbud, pussy 
willow and winter jasmine. 
Just place the stems in warm 
water, and there should be 
flowers in 2 to 3 weeks. For 
best results, change the wa­
ter and cut an inch from each 
stem every 3 or 4 days. Select 
branches with an abundance 
of swollen flowerbuds, cut­
ting only those that will not 
affect the overall appearance 
of your plant.

The best time to prune 
roses in our area is from 
March 1 to March 15. If you 
prune these too early they 
will put on new growth which 
would be damaged by a

freeze. Hybrid teas and bush 
type roses need to be pruned 
back severely each year to 
keep bushes from becoming 
a tangled mass and flower 
quality will be poor. To 
produce show roses, cut the 
canes to about 6 to 8 inches 
above the ground. Other 
wise leave 12 to 15 inches 
above ground. Retain only 3 
to 6 vigorous canes, remov­
ing all others down to the 
graft (swelling at base of 
plant).

Norma's Kountry Kitchon

Broasted or Mod Chkkon
HAMBUKGIKS-PIZZAS- 

SANDWICHIS-FISH i  fRIlS 

Chicken Spocial every Wed.
So. MO Ph. 392-3508

r 1

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Kost 
spent the weekend in Snyder 
and Lubbock, returning 
home Monday before the ice 
storm hit the Panhandle.
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Dale’s Electric
Residential-Commercial-Industrial

Ditch Witch Services
We sell Berkley Water Pumps

Refrigeration Repairs

Free Estimates
24 Hr. Service

Ph. 392-2801
Day or Night

Fully Insured
Dale Hobson, Owner

1108  Ave. J.
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«OlV BIBLE

h T

There uas plent\ ot yasolme diinnii the hli/./.ard. 
\e t  weeouldn t eo anywhere. So we made the best ot it. 
and tried to help one amnher.

Our soeiety is ehanging today. We are learning to 
eope. To appreciate what we have in abundance. Make 
do with what's in short supply. Share!

The message of our churches has not changed. I'he\ 
have always reminded us that life should not be mea­
sured in terms ot'material possessions. Christ in his own 
way offered men an abundant life.

For the Christian believer and worshipper that abun­
dant life is founded on spiritual conviction and commit­
ment. It includes things that blizzards and gas crunches 
cannot take away.

Come worship this week and share in the abundant
life.

Sundfu' Mondcu' 'i uesdu\' IVednnsdav Thursdax 
V/ritfheu' Acts james I }ohn J'J’iinotln

1 2 .1 -1 9
Matthew 

6.-5-15

Friday Saturda\ 
P.salms Psalms 
6 6 .1 -2 0  65 :1 -1 5

1:1-6 5:6-21 2 :1 -15

Copyright 1983 Keister Advertising Service 
P. O. Box 8024. Charlottesville. Virginia 22906

Scriptures selected by The American Bible Society

/  . ... -

This series o f ads is being published and sponsored by the Ozona 

business firms in the interest o f a stronger community.

l-B  M otor C o ., Inc. Brown Furniture
Ozona National Bank Ozona TV  System
Ozona Butane Co. South Texas Lm br. Co.
Jim 's Foodway W hite's Auto

Ozona Stockman
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Crop insurance lowers 
production risks SALE STARTS MONDAT JA N .S Ist  thru SAT. FEB. 5th

Production and financial 
risks facing Texas farmers in 
1983 take on greater signi­
ficance during the current 
difficult times for agricul­
ture.

A crop insurance program 
is one means available to 
farmers to counteract the 
production risks they face 
every year, reminds Dr. 
James Ahrenholz, econo­
mist-management with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service.

“ There is a cost for such 
crop protection, and each 
farmer will need to look at his 
particular situation to evalu­
ate crop insurance,” Ahren­
holz says.

The All-Risk Crop Insur­
ance program is available to 
provide some protection 
against reduced crop yields 
from natural causes. The 
program allows farmers to 
choose among three levels of 
coverage. These are either 50 
percent, 65 percent or 75 
percent of the yield estab­
lished for their farm unit, 
Ahrenholz reminds.

In addition, farmers may 
choose among three levels of 
price protection for their in­
sured crop. For example, he 
emphasized, grain sorghum 
producers in Texas may 
choose either $2.00/bu., 
$2.40/bu. or $2.60/bu. as the 
settlement price for any loss 
in production.

Many farmers have indica­
ted that the area yield es­
tablished for a crop on their 
farm does not accurately 
reflect their production and 
thus the protection they 
would like to have. The In­
dividual Yield Coverage pro­
gram addresses this concern. 
Thus, a farmer with 3 years 
of verifiable production rec­
ords may be eligible to have 
the yield coverage increased 
for his farm unit by certi­
fying those records with the 
county Agricultural Stabiliz­
ation and Conservation Ser­
vice (ASCS) office at least 15 
days before the insurance 
sales closing date.

Crop insurance coverage 
will be increased for farmers 
participating in the recently

announced Payment in Kind 
or “ crop swap” program. 
Yield coverage increases of 6 
percent, 8 percent or 10 
percent will apply depending 
upon the level of a farm­
er’s participation in the Pay­
ment in Kind program. 
These higher yield guaran­
tees are applied with no 
increase in the crop insur­
ance premium rate, the spec­
ialist adds.

To participate in the All- 
Risk Insurance program, a 
farmer must sign an applica­
tion before the established 
deadline. That deadline has

been set at March 15 for 
South, West, Central and 
Northeast Texas and the Gulf 
Coast. In the Texas Pan­
handle, South Plains and 
Rolling Plains, the deadline 
will be April 15.

Farmers should contact 
their local All-Risk crop in­
surance agent about yield 
guarantee and premium in­
formation for their farm unit.

Since these factors vary for 
each individual situation, in­
surance is one risk man­
agement tool that farmers 
should carefully evaluate, 
Ahrenholz suggests.

WTU announces new 
energy-saving plan
West Texas Utilities Co. 

has announced a new energy 
savings plan providing cash 
incentives to encourage its 
customers to purchase high- 
efficiency air-conditioning 
and home heating equip­
ment.

The program is available 
for single-family residential 
customers. Don Welch, vice 
president and director of cus­
tomer services, said the pur­
pose of the plan is to urge 
customers to install higher 
efficiency equipment to help 
reduce the peak summer de­
mand for electricity.

“ If more of our residen­
tial customers install bettei 
equipment, we can make 
more efficient use of our 
present generating stations 
and prolong the installation 
of expensive new units,” 
Welch said. “ This would 
benefit all of our customers 
in the long run.”

The new program provides 
cash incentives for air-con­
ditioners, both central and 
window units; heat pumps, 
heat-recovery units for elec­
tric water heaters, and solar- 
assisted electric heaters in 
single family homes which 
are served by WTU.

The homes must meet 
WTU’s energy efficient
home requirements, which

involves such things as in­
sulation, weatherstripping, 
and storm windows.

Momlay
Spaghetti and meat sauce 
Buttered Peas 
Tossed Salad 
Sliced Peaches 
Hot Rolls 

Tuesday
Hamburger on Bun 
French Fries
Lettuce, Tomatoes, Pickles 
Applesauce 

Wednesday 
Burritos 
Buttered Corn 
Vegetable Salad 
Peach Cobbler 

Thursday 
Spanish Steak 
Mashed Potatoes 
Cole Slaw 
Sugar Cookies 
Cornbread 

Friday
Fried chicken and gravy 
Creamed Potatoes 
Buttered peas 
Mixed Fruit 
Hot Rolls

License rule
\ TRUEHEAT I change

T H 3 6
•UL Approved 
•Heat Circulating 
•Optional:
Outside Air;
Glass Doors

•36" Firebrick lined 
Firebox

•25 Year Limited 
Warranty

Fireplace, 9 ft. pipe, 
cap, Flashing, and 
collor.
Complete

Reg. $557
NOW

$ 4 0 Q o o

HOUSE OF FIREPLACES
1121 S.ChadbouriM 653-3140

for drivers
Joe Miles, DPS, in charge 

of drivers’ license division, 
announced this week that the 
department had put a new 
rule into effect. Instead of 
renewing a driver’s license 
within 90 days of its expir­
ation date, it may now be 
renewed up to twelve 
months.

This option will be avail­
able to applicants for dupli­
cate licenses that expire dur­
ing the next twelve months 
as well as any license holder 
desiring early renewal.

The 30-day renewal period 
of provisional licenses, those 
under 18-years of age, will 
remain the same.

Miles is at the DPS of­
fice here each Friday for 
renewal of drivers licenses 
and driver tests.

BASEB ALL 
EQ U IP M EN T

BE READY FOR 
BASEBALL, SOFTBALL AND 
LITTLE LEAGUE WITH NEW 
EQUIPMENT & UNIFORMS 

NOW AT SUPER SPORTS
 ̂ 'THE SPORTS HEADQUARTERS "

I •'AW FREE C A P
BRING THIS AD TO 

SUPER SPORTS FOR YOUR CAP

/ y j p x i r r  iS) 1

V ^  Ang«te'i Wmttr Sports HMdquartsn” 1 
Southvmt Ptau 944-29H 1
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Ozona High School

Notes from the locker room—
By-Ross Alexander

The iceman melted all over 
the floor in Ballinger the 
other night. The usually calm 
and reserved Lion head 
coach John Curry drew a 
technical foul for a parti­
cularly expressive outburst 
of rage (and possibly a bit of 
despair) at one of the offi­
cials in Ballinger’s gymna­
sium. Poor Coach Curry must 
find this first season’s er­
ratic results very exhaust­
ing and somewhat disap­
pointing, so far. He is a 
disciple of the Dean Smith 
school of basketball who has 
inherited a team of horses 
who seem to be most com­
fortable with a run, run, run, 
and then run some more type 
game. Not a lot of real 
basketball know-how, but 
plenty of team speed and 
overall hustle...enough it 
would seem to produce a 
winning season.

But Coach Curry is a 
teacher, and his system will

be absorbed by his under­
classmen, and he will have 
quite a squad before too very 
long. How many have really 
stopped and looked at the 
fine job the J.V. team is 
doing this season? They 
must be leading the District, 
and they are doing it despite 
the loss of Sanchez, who 
used to score as many as 30 
points a game. (Wouldn’t it 
be terrific if Steve would cut 
loose for a 25 or 30 point 
game against Coahoma Fri­
day night?)

David Vargas has shown 
that he has a touch and A1 
Ramirez has been very im­
pressive. These two can 
shoot and play defense. 
Looking at the J.V. squad, 
you can see some pretty good 
athletes playing some solid 
winning basketball. I’ve 
watched Ed Borrego and 
Harvey Fierro in practice and 
they are simply good basket­
ball players. Delgado and 
Davis play as good at their

position as coach Porter 
could ask.

The girls’ J.V. team has 
the secret success formula on 
display everytime they hit 
the floor. Maybe the varsity 
units can gain something by 
observing our J.V. girls’ 
team this season. Watch Kim 
and Donna interact with each 
other...watch the eye contact 
that invariably develops be­
tween Raedene and Donna... 
notice how intense the con­
centration on Vanessa’s face 
sometimes. These kids are 
winners, and its something 
that they know, so they just 
go out and beat people... 
simple as that. Olga doesn’t 
know how to take it easy 
when she’s in there. Coach 
Stark has got a team loaded 
to the top with talented 
winners. They are an inspir­
ation, as well as exciting to 
watch.

The Lionettes don’t want 
to set a record for conse­
cutive losses. As it is the 0-1

start isn’t such upbeat news, 
the second half promises to 
be a tough one for Coach 
Williams’ crew with Marley 
Wilson out for the season 
and starting guard Irma 
Ybarra ailing.

The balance of the district 
schedule seems to favor Col­
orado City, but I’m not yet 
convinced that they have a 
better team than Ozona, 
frankly. That game last week 
in Davidson Memorial Gym­
nasium raised more ques­
tions in my mind than it 
answered. No question that 
Coach Curry’s brilliant late 
4th quarter moves produced 
a come-from-behind, go- 
ahead surge, but that Colo. 
City is vulnerable to the 
brand of ball we play so well. 
If Ozona takes Sonora, Coa­
homa, and Colorado City, the 
Ballinger and Crane crowd 
can neutralize one another 
allowing the Lions to take it 
all. They would then be able 
to help by avenging them­

selves against Ballinger at 
home the last game of the 
regular district season.

OHS Athletic Director Rip 
Sewell will address the an­
nual Texas High School

Coaches’ Association at their 
mid-year conference to be 
held in Odessa this weekend. 
He will discuss Track and 
Field, I understand.

This week’s trivia ques­
tion: Which Ozona coach was 
an outstanding high school 
basketball player (all-state) 
who played in, and was 
selected all-tournament fol­
lowing, the Ozona Annual 
Basketball Tournament a 
while back? This fellow went 
on to college where he ex­
celled in basketball, and was 
the star quarterback in his 
senior year!!

All who answered Don Ab­
bott get a free Frankenber- 
ry breakfast the 5th Friday in 
February.

*' if ^ i-4i

OZONA BASKETBALL 1982-83

d a t e  -- ------ — JR- VARSITY 1 FRESHMEN | 8TH GRADE | 7TH GRADE
FEB. 1 •SONORAH-SrOO ^ *SONORA-H-5:00

B&G
FEB. 4 *COAHOMA.H-5:00

B&G
*COAHOMA-H-5:00
B&G

FEB. 7 l-T. STUCKTUN-T- 
5:30-B&G

BIG LAKE-T-4:30 
B&G

BIG LAK£-T-4:30 
B&G_________________

FEB. 8 •CRANE-T-5:fi0
B&G

•CRANE-T.5:00
B&G

FEB. 11 ♦COLORADO CITY- 
T-StOO-B&G

♦COLORADO CITY-T- 
S:00-B&G PER. 14 --------------------

FEB. 15 •SONORA-T-B ♦SONUKA-T-5:00
B IRAAN-H-5:6o IRAAN-H-S:00D e.r'

FEB. 18 •BALUNGER-H-B ♦BALLINGER-H- 
5:00-B_____________ ____

♦DISTRIC [GAMES

Sponsored By These Ozona Businesses:
w o o l OKOWiRS c a m u i s t o r a g e

D i lA  ROSA n u m m  s a .

HRST SAVttKS S  lO A N
Ozona Branch

MAYFIELD CONSTRUCTION

TITE BISHOP WELDING WATSON'S
FOXW ORTH^ALBRAITH i'S P IZZA

JA Y  M IUER CONSTRUCTION 
OZONA TELEVISION SYSTEM

OZONA STEAK HOUSE SKAINS MOTOR CO, MOORE OIL
OZONA Q U K K  STOP

OZONA NATIONAL BANK 
SIZEMORE FUNERAL HOME

FENTON'S WATER STA,
JIM 'S FOODW AY 
WHTTEHOUSE CO.

SONNY'S DRIVE-IN GRO. HAPPY HO liOW

FESCO, IN C
0 J .B „  IN C  
THE LINE

WEST TEXAS WEED WASH 
C/RClf BAR TRUCK CORRAL

DINA'S POCO TACO LIU Y  WELDING

flMA'S ROADSIDE GRO.
WESTERMAN DRUG 
EL CHATO'S RESTAURANT

OZONA INN OF THE WEST 
SOUTH TEXAS LUMBER CO.

BROWN FURNITURE

SM AU FASHIONS 
OZO N^ BUTANE 
KYLE KLEANERS

THE B A G G EH  AGENCY
MANESS TEXACO STATIONS 
I W GULF SELF SERVICE

WHITES AUTO
NICK'S CHEVRON

THORP'S LAUN-DRY THORNTON'S SUPERMARKET I'S INN
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Shade trees seldom need fertilizer!
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TRAPPED FOR THIRTY MINUTES in this overturned car 
was Mrs. Iva Macon, who suffered severe injuries when this 
small car in which she was a passenger rolled over and hit a 
tree near here Thursday morning. Ozona firemen spent the

better part of half an hour using the jaws of life to free Mrs. 
Macon. John Hollingsworth, the driver, escaped with minor 
injuries.

Wildcat on tap for Crockett Co.
Maralo Inc., Midland, will 

drill the No. 1 Feisberg, an 
11,300-foot wildcat in Crock­
ett County, H-mile south­
west of an 11,495-foot fail­
ure, 7/8-mile southwest of 
the depleted opener and lone 
producer of the Quantos 
(Ellenburger oil) field and 10 
miles north of Iraan.

Location is 1,980 feet from 
the south and 890 feet from 
the west lines of 19-HH- 
GC&SF. Ground elevation is 
2,626.5 feet.

The Quantos opener, H.L. 
Brown Jr. No. 1 Ruth Schlin- 
ke, drilled to 11,420 feet, was 
finaled Sept. 3, 1968 for 204 
barrels of 44.5 gravity oil, no 
water, with gas-oil ratio of 
451-1, through a 24-64-inch 
choke and perforations at 
11,368-386 feet.

The failure, H.L. Brown 
No. 1 Mabel Strauss, was 
abandoned March 26, 1969.

The Noelke, West multi­
pay field of Crockett County 
gained its second Felker gas 
producer and a location west- 
northwest extension to that 
pay with completion of 
MGMT & Sales Consultants 
Inc., San Angelo, No. 1 
Halff-Roberts, 3 Vi-miles 
southeast of Iraan, for a 
calculated, absolute open 
flow of 64,000 cubic feet of 
gas daily.

Production was natural 
from 842-848 feet, identi­
fied as open hole.

Location is 838 feet from 
the south and 1,812 feet from 
the west lines of 70-1-I& 
GN.

The American multipay

field gained its third Spra- 
berry B gas producer and a 3 
1/8-mile north extension to 
that pay with reclassifica­
tion of Dameron Petroleum 
Corp., Midland, No. 1-18 
Virginia Hoover-Sec. 18, 
Block NN, former Spraberry

B oil producer, 19 miles
southwest of Ozona, for a cal­
culated, absolute open flow 
of 1,150,000 cubic feet of gas 
daily.

Production was through 
perforations at 4,232-80 feet, 
which had been acidized with

Agriculture woes is 
concern for bankers

1,400 gallons and fractured 
with 50,000 gallons and 
78,000 pounds of sand.

It originally was finaled 
March 4, 1982 for 20.7 
barrels of oil, gravity unre­
ported, no water, with gas- 
pil ratio of 10,273-1, through 
a 12-64-inch choke and the 
above perforations.

Location is 3,000 feet from 
the north and 660 feet from 
the east lines of 18-NN- 
GC&SF.

^  Me 
am/

JENNIFER MARLEY

NAN KIEFER 
Bride-elect of R. J. Everett III

KAYE THOMPSON

Have made selections 
in housewares at

High production and low 
prices are plaguing agricul­
ture in the 1980s. Survival of 
the food and fiber produc­
tion business and the entire 
rural community that de­
pends on agriculture is a 
major concern of commercial 
bankers of Texas.

The 1983 Texas Farm and 
Ranch Credit Conference for 
Commercial Bankers at Tex­
as A&M University, Feb. 27- 
March 1, is designed to 
provide persons in the farm 
credit area with an update on 
current conditions for the 
agricultural economy and 
give insight into dealing with 
the risks of making credit 
available during the current 
times of economic uncertain­
ty, says Dr. Robert B. Sch- 
wart.

Schwart is a dairy market­
ing economist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice.

Conference sessions will 
be in the J. Earl Rudder 
Conference Center.

Among headliners will be 
Phil Gramm, former U.S. 
congressman and economist 
at Texas A&M, who will 
discuss “ Economic Out­
look.” The Hon. Charles 
Stenholm, U.S. congressman 
from Stamford and member 
of the Agriculture Commit­
tee of the U.S. Congress, will 
discuss “ Washington’s Role 
in Farm Survival.’’ Jim 
Hightower, Texas commis­
sioner of agriculture, will 
speak on the state of the 
Texas agricultural economy.

Other topics for discus­
sion include evaluating crop 
insurance for financial risk 
management and outlook for 
the major commodities of 
importance to Texas.

C oncurren t sess io n s , 
Schwart said, will deal with 
row crops, cattle and dairy 
loans. Other sessions will 
deal with regional loan prob­
lems and opportunities.

For registration informa­
tion, contact Dr. Richard 
Trimble, Department of Ag­
ricultural Economics, Texas 
A&M University, College

Station, Tx. 77843 or call 
(713)845-8012.

An Agricultural Credit An­
alysis Workship is scheduled 
to follow the Bankers’ Con­
ference, March 2-3. Assist­
ing the Extension Service in 
sponsoring the activities are 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
periment Station, A&M’s 
College of Agriculture and 
Texas Bankers Association.

Corduroy is now the most 
popular fabirc, says Becky 
Saunders, clothing specia­
list with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service, Tex­
as A&M University System. 
It is used widely this season 
in slacks and jeans.

PHONE NEWS TO 
OZONA STOCKMAN.

THE

Shade trees seldom need 
fertilization although fertiliz­
er is sometimes needed when 
tree roots are confined by a 
street, curb or other struc­
ture.

Tree fertilization isn’t 
needed more than once every 
three years (except in ex­
tremely sandy soils), says 
Billy Reagor, county agent 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Fertilize trees during the 
winter months, Reagor says. 
But when trees have a re­
stricted root system, another 
application may be needed in 
early summer.

Fertilizer recommenda­
tions are often based on a 
tree’s trunk diameter without 
allowing for a confined or 
limited root zone. Following 
such recommendations can 
lead to over-fertilization.

Over-fertilizing forces ex­
cessive top growth and 
makes the tree more vulner­
able to storm damage.

The safest method of de­
ciding the amount of fertili­
zer needed is to determine 
the number of square feet 
included in the branch 
spread of the tree and use 2 
pounds of nitrogen for each 
1,000 square feet covered, 
Reagor explains.

For instance, a tree with a 
36-foot branch spread covers 
about 1,000 feet. Twenty- 
four pounds of a complete 
fertilizer with an analysis of 
8-8-8 supplies the 2 pounds 
of nitrogen needed.

If the root zone of this tree

New adult 
class for 
Methodists

Ozona United Methodist 
Church is starting a new 
adult Sunday School class for 
“ Pairs and Spares,” begin­
ning Sunday, Feb. 6 at 10 
a.m. The Rev. Wayne Boyce 
will be the teacher for the 
Bible study class.

Sunday at 7:30 a.m. the 
Men’s Fellowship Breakfast 
will be held at the church. All 
are welcome.

is confined to a 22 feet by 20 
feet area, fertilizer applica­
tion depends on the actual 
root zone—240 square feet.

This is one-fourth of the area 
in the above example, so only 
6 pounds of 8-8-8 fertiliz­
er should be applied.

STANDING 
KING ORGAN

G&MTRAINING  
CHRISTOVAL, TX .

CALL 915-896-2379 OR 
915-658-7186  

AFTER 6 P.M. WEEKDAYS

'2975
C O M p L i T E

oo

GUARANTEED 2 FULL YEARS

□  Heavy screen mesh fo r w ind load resistance and a 
transparent appearance.
□  Easy assem bly requ iring  on ly one size nut and bolt.
□  Detailed engineering to guarantee bu ilt-in  parabolic 
accuracy.
□  C om pute r stam ped-out parts that let you convert a 10’ 
system to a 13’ system by replacing the 6 petals w ith a simple 
tu rn  of the bolt.
□  Polar m ounts that are easily converted from manual to 
m otorized systems.
□  Specialized w eld ing to prevent puckering and gapping m 
the curve of the screen
□  Baked po lym er coating for unifc/i m coverage and m<i> nnum 
weather protection.

TEXSRN 6 5 5 - S O a O
1324 W. BEAUREGARD . SAN ANGELO. TEXAS 76901

Deliveries To  Your Door 
Coming Soon

Pepe’s Restaurant
Pizzas Hamburgers 

Steaks Sandwiches

. MOBILE HOME SALE . MOBILE HOME SALE . MOBILE HOME SALE

9 \ r I i n d t o n
'Notions No. 1 Monufocturor' by ‘̂Bringing Amenca home

i l

B T S  HAIR DESIGNS
B IL L Y  TUBLAND

&
SUSIE DEATON  

Open 9:00-Till

Mon, thru Sat.
Specialize in haircuts, perms, 

color and sets

Men, Women, & Children ^

P h o n e  392-5826 1108^2 Beafi St.

WAIOIMI 1 1
■...........± L |

BEDROOM

«UN/0«Y

[ ! j . - BED
ROOM

• ’-2”
'■MfIT WASOI

1
H > 
r

I
K IT C H E N /

LiV IN Q  R O O M  D iN IN Q
• ’-10’ I • ’-0’

14" X 46" Two Bedroom Mobile Home 
Delivered, Set Up and Tied Down.

DOWN MONTHLY SALE
PAYMENT PAYMENT PRICE

10%
15.75% A.P.R. FOR 144 MONTHS $9880

Ookwood Mobile Homes
4422 North Chodbourne San Angelo, Tx.

(915)658-8569
No. 1 1n Service Since 1946 With 49 Locations,

. MOBILE HOME SALE . MOBILE HOME SALE . MOBILE HOME SALE

WTU offers a

C A S H
B O N U S  PLAN
FOR INSTALLING RESIDENTIAL ENERGY EFFICIENT 
ELECTRIC AIR CONDITIONERS, HEAT PUMPS, AND 
HEAT RECOVERY UNITS IN A NEW OR EXISTING 
SINGLE FAMILY HOME.

E. S. P.
(Energ\f Savings Plan)

NOW WTU WILL PAY YOU TO SAVE ENERGY. WHEN YOU BUY 
ENERGY EFFICIENT EQUIPMENT YOU NOT ONLY GET A CASH 
BONUS, YOU ALSO SAVE MONEY ON FUTURE ENERGY BILLS. 
WTU WANTS YOU TO BUY ENERGY EFFICIENT EQUIPMENT 
BECAUSE IT HELPS TO HOLD DOWN DEMAND FOR 
ELECTRICITY, AND LESS DEMAND HELPS US POSTPONE 
BUILDING NEW AND EXPENSIVE POWER PLANTS.

Cash Incentives for New or Existing Single Family Homes

HEAT PUMPS
SEER/EER 8 and Above

Central Systems....................................$110 Per Ton
Window Units 11,999 B T U .................S 60 Per Unit

and Below
12.000 BTU and Above....................... S 75 Per Unit

AIR CONDITIONERS
SEER/EER 8.5 and Above

Central Systems....................................$ 50 Per Ton
Window Units 11,999 B T U .................$ 40 Per Unit

and Below
12.000 BTU and Above....................... S 50 Per Unit

Heat Recovery 
For Electric Water Heating 

S100 Per Unit

Solar-assisted Electric Water Heating 
$100 Per Unit

To Qualify, Your Home must be served by WTU and 
m eet our Energy Efficiency Requirements.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Member of The Central and South West System

For more Information, Get your Free E. S. R Booklet at any 
West Texas Utilities Office.
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Grow your own garden 
transplants from seed

It will be time to set out 
garden transplants before 
you know it. Although nur­
serymen try to stock repre­
sentative varieties of vegeta­
bles and flowers during the 
spring garden rush, it’s just 
not possible for even the 
largest nursery to have every 
variety. For this reason, you 
may want to start some of 
your own transplants.

The 1983 mail order nur­
sery catalogs are arriving at a 
steady rate. View them and 
make purchases with a pur­
pose. Inexperienced garden­
ers (or those unfamiliar with 
the Texas climate) should not 
waste money on seeds that 
have no chance of coming to 
bloom or fruit in Texas. 
Experienced gardeners may 
want to try new and dif­
ferent varieties of the old 
standards. Restraint is not 
easy when you look at page 
after page of pure horticul­
tural perfection, but remem­
ber that ordering seed is the 
easy part.

Sow seed for your trans­
plants at the proper time. 
Some transplants such as 
cabbage, broccoli, lettuce, 
green onions and spinach can 
be set in the garden 4 to 5 
weeks before the last frost. 
Now is the time to sow the

seeds of these early trans­
plants.

Use a soiless or commer­
cial potting mix available at 
nurseries. Expandable peat 
pellets also work well. Ger­
m ination  te m p e ra tu re s  
should be near 75°F. during 
the day and 65®-70°F. dur­
ing the night.

Seeds can be started in 
milk cartons, cake pans, 
flower pots or almost any 
container that you are willing 
to punch holes in for drain­
age. Thoroughly moisten the 
planting medium and evenly 
space the seed on top. Cov­
er lightly, re-water and then 
enclose the container in a 
polyethylene bag. Keep the 
plastic covered container out 
of direct sunlight or it will 
overheat.

When seeds begin to 
sprout, gradually remove the 
bag during a several day 
period. This lessens shock. 
You’ll have to water more 
often when the poly bag is 
removed.

Most would-be transplant 
growers make two big mis­
takes. They start seed too 
early and they provide insuf­
ficient light for the devel­
oping seedlings. Both mala­
dies allow transplants to 
become spindly, weak and

yellow. Fluorescent grow 
lights help overcome the 
second problem. They must 
be within 4 inches of newly j 
developing seedling leaves to 
be of much benefit.

In mid-February sow to­
mato, eggplant, pepper and 
flower seeds. You may want 
to try these tomato varie­
ties in comparison plantings \ 
with your usual ones: Spring 
Giant, Early Girl, Park’s 
Whopper, Roramerica, Big 
Set, Super Fantastic and 
Quick Pick. The results may 
be very enlightening.

Sowing small-seeded an­
nuals directly in the bed 
usually ends in failure and 
frustration. For this reason, 
start your own transplants of 
alyssum, moss rose, fibrous 
rooted begonia, petunia, 
cockscomb, impatiens and 
coleus. Move your trans­
plants to their final place 
when they are of adequate 
size (usually 3-5 true leaves) 
and conditions are suitable 
for plant growth outdoors.

KELCO SATELLITE SYSTEMS

SPHERICAL PARABOLIC

LIVE IN THE STICKS? 
WANT GREAT TV?

As low as
$1,995

in kit form for you 
“do-it-yourselfers.”

FROM $2,650.00, COMPLETELY INSTALLED, 
WARRANTED, WITH A YEAR’S SUBSCRIP- 
TION TO SAT-GUIDE, THE PROGRAMMING 
SCHEDULE. THESE SYSTEMS CAN RECEIVE 
ALL SATELLITE VIDEO TRANSMISSIONS.

Call Dan Keleher 
(512) 896-6071 or 866 3452 
KELCO SATElLfTE SYSTEMS 

2210 Junction Hwy., Suite One 
Kerrvilie, Texas 78028

Rankin art 
craft show 
scheduled

The Rankin Art Associa­
tion announces a new feature 
at their fourth annua) art and 
craft show. A youth division 
will be added this year. 
There wiH be three divi­
sions; elementary, middle 
school and high school. Rib­
bons will be awarded. En­
try fee is free.

The arts and craft show 
will be held March 17, 18, 19 
at the Rankin Park Build­
ing. Entries will be accept­
ed Thursday March 17 from 
9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Judg­
ing will be the morning of 
March 18 from 9:00 a.m, to 
12:00 noon. Public display 
will be March 18 from 9:00 
a.m. to 12:00 noon. Public 
display will be March 18 
from 1:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
and March 19 from 9:00 a.m. 
to 2:00 p.m. Entries may be 
picked up March 19 from 
2:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. Cash 
awards and ribbons will be 
given.

There will be a $3.00 per 
entry fee for members and a 
$5.(W per entry fee for non­
members.

Judging the Art division 
will be Dr. Charles Stewart of 
Midland. Janet Rogers of 
Greenwood will judge the 
craft division.

For more information con­
tact Ann Kelley at 693-2867 
or Uvonne Morgan at 
693-2763.
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Crockett County 

Care Center News
BY ANN McCartney  

DIRECTOR OF ACTIVITIES & SOCIAL CARE

Ode to "Flunkey of Yearu W1

Ffdlowing Is the citation 
making Dee Kellers ‘‘Finn- 
key of the Year” in poetry. no

Fourth Sunday services 
were held by the Church of 
Christ. They brought a nice 
worship and song service for 
our residents.

Monday morning domi­
noes were played by Paul 
Cavin, Maude Pettit, and Ola 
Mills.

Monday afternoon resi­
dents were treated to a film 
presentation given by Luciie 
Harrell. This program show­
ing her trip to the Holy Land 
was truly enjoyed by our 
residents.

Tuesday morning bingo 
winner of the El Chato dinner 
for two was Moriama Perez. 
Volunteers included Dorothy 
Doll, Alice Ross.Doris Karr, 
and Liz Mary Pipes. Follow­
ing the game seven residents 
took advantage of their cer­
tificates and went to El 
Chato’;; to eat. Those making 
tiie trip included Carol Reed, 
Juana Hernandez, Paul Cav­
in, Tomasa Ramos, Virginia 
Russet). Ola Mills, and 
Maude Pettit, Winning din­
ners were brought back to 
Jesus Hernandez and Mori­
ama Perez. Dorothy Doll was 
once again the volunteer who 
furnished an extra car for 
this field trip. Also going and 
furnishing transportation 
were Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Tambunga and their daugh­
ter Ruby Jean.

Wednesday morning cera­
mics were once again led by 
Ruth Hester and Marie Pier­
son. Residents enjoying the 
activity included Juana Her­
nandez, Frances Borrego, 
Tomasa Ramos, Maude Pet­
tit, Ola Mills and Moriama 
Perez.

W ednesday afte rnoon  
crafts were enjoyed by Juan- 
a Hernandez, Ola Mills, 
Moriama Perez, and Maude 
Pettit. These ladies all made 
valentines to give to their 
families. Maude Pettit fresh­
ened up valentines that were 
later hung on all residents 
doors, a beautiful way of 
helping decorate for our next

Sewing for 
children

holiday.
Thursday morning beauty 

shop was manned by Bonnie 
Warth, Madye Jo Hump­
hreys, and Arlene Clayton.

TTiursday afternoon resi­
dents again were given a 
Bible Study by Rev. Dennis 
McKain. Maude Pettit 
played the piano. Marie Wal­
ker was on hand to assist 
with the singing. This was 
followed by Spanish hour 
given by the following: Mar­
ie Vitela, Paulita Leal. Car­
men Vargas. Sulema Mar­
tinez. Felipa Munoz, Blanco 
Castro, and Margie Moran, 
Residents attending included 
Tomasa Ramos, Juana Her­
nandez, Jesus Hernandez, 
Mauricio Hernandez, Fran­
ces Borrego, Moriama Perez, 
Ramona Lugo and Delfina 
Lara.

Thursday night residents 
were treated to a slide-^ilm 
presentation given by Jane 
Black showing her trip to 
Ireland and England. Her 
pictures and commentary 
made for a very enjoyable 
alternative to nighttime T.V. 
watching.

Friday morning bingo win­
ner was Maggie Crawford, 
She was awarded a certifi­
cate from Westerman Drug. 
Second place winner was Ola 
Mills. Ramona Lugo won the 
Baker Jewelers award. Vol­
unteers were Alice Ross and 
Anna Bell Patrick.

Friday afternoon the fol­
lowing residents attended 
our monthly residents coun­
cil meeting, Tomasa Ramos, 
Moriama Perez, Carol Reed, 
Frances Borrego, Juana Her­
nandez, and Ola Mills. Res­
idents reviewed plans for 
February activities, voiced 
the opinion that they liked 
nighttime slide presenta­
tions, decided on what they 
wanted to cook for the Val­
entine party. Residents were 
reminded that if they had 
friends or relatives who 
played a musical instrument, 
whether it be a piano, a 
guitar, or some other instru­
ment, they slmuld remind 
sthem how much a perform­
ance would mean to our 
residents. How about it 
friends?

He’s a man that’s tall,
A man with a grin 

His large helping hand 
Is there again and again 

He’s always available 
He never says No 

He even cooks burgers 
at the Junior Rodeo 

Whether it’s for the 
Scouts, 

the Blood Bank, or Little 
League Games.
He’s either helping or teach­
ing;

Boy

To him, it’s the same
He carries the load like 
one we know

He relates to all ages whet­
her young or old.
He’s an EMT, a Fireman, 
and so much more 
A man of great stature, yet 

never too large for a 
helping chore.
So here’s to Dee Keilers, 

A greater flunky there’ll 
never be
From All of Ozona 

We say ...“ Thank 
Dee!”
By-Johnny Childress

i< ^ ^ l
, MRS. JIMMY GILLlf 

Has made 
bridal selections

at

you.

W oU m '5
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Pi.BALL BUSTER ) Thimiiger^

SOFTBALL SHOW
INCLUDING

BASEBALL & LIHLE LEAGUE
★  PREVIEW THE '83 UNIFORMS
★  VISIT WITH FACTORY REPRESENTATIVES
★  MANY SHOW SPECIALS

DATE:
THURS. EVE.

LOCATION:
UNIVERSITY INN
s o . BRYANT BLVD.

FEB. 3rd.
TIME:
6:30pm-10:30pm

Coaches don’t miss this one, 
bring your sponsors,bring your 
players or just bring a friend. 
All persons affiliated with Little 
League,Youth Baseball or any 
other form of Teenage Baseball 
please don’t miss tnis chance 
to save your League hundreds 
of dollars.

FOR
MORE INFORMATION  

CALL 658-5437 
SAN ANGELO

ATHLETICS
& SILKSCREENINC

668-5437
2421 SHERWOOD.WAY

saves 1st ANNIVERSARYI CELEBRATIN G OUR 1st ANNIVERSARY! CELEBRATING O
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“ Saving money is the ma­
jor reason for increased in­
terest in sewing children’s 
clothing,” says Becky Saun­
ders. clothing specialist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

“ More mothers are also 
sewing because children ap­
preciate something made 
just for them,” she adds.

Children under six years 
old usually are not too par­
ticular about how a garment 
fits or how it is made. This 
gives a mother time to learn 

^  or to improve sewing skills, 
^  Saunders says. Children’s 
^  clothing is excellent for 
^  learning since it requires less 
Of fabric and many unused gar­

ments can be remade.

10 lbs. WASN’T ENOUGH! 
A Perfect Figure Was Her

Carolyn Stinson Came To

MS. STINSON’S TRUE STORY:

According to Saunders, a 
recent survey of clothing 
stores in the south shows the'j 
high cost of children’s cloth­
ing. Dresses bought in a 

^  department store range from 
u* $25 to over $50.

Aero Vac Charter Service

Similar dresses can be 
made in around three hours 
for less than $10 if the home 
sewer used fashion fabric 
costing from $3 to $7 per 
yard. Pull-on pants cost 
about $20 but can be made 
for just over $5 in about one 
hour, Saunders notes.

Three years ago at 171*4 lbs. I made one of the rtiost impor­
tant decisions of my life and that was to lose some weight.

My original goal was 10 lbs. however, not until I lost 56!4 lbs. 
was I truly happy with my figure.

Through the careful guidance and assistance of the counselors 
at Pat Walkers, who literally taught me how to eat the foods I 
like, properly and the firming and toning provided by the Symme- 
tricon, I feel absolutely marvelous, much younger and more ener­
getic than ever.

FREE TREATMENT & 
FIGURE ANALYSIS

AeroVac Charter Service lets yon set your owa 
schedule. Yon leave when you want to leave. 
With AeroVac there are no parking or baggage 
pick-up hassles-no layovers or tranters. You 
save time and money.

For business or pleasure, fly AeroVac.

LUBBOCK-l Hr. 15 Min. EL PASO-1 Hr. 55 Min. 

SAN ANTONIO-1 Hr, 10 Min. M IDLAND-42 Min.

DALLAS-1 Hr. 50 Min. HOUSTON-2 Hrs. 15 Min.i 
RUIDOSA, N.M.-2 Hrs. 5 Min.

eariy to insure your reservations

392-3243 392-3619 392-3300

A brand 
for the future

WADE A. MOSLEY 
MANAGER 

Bex 397 
Sonora, Texas

Our treatments are personalized, natural and 
gentle, without disrobing or rigid diets; In 
com ^te privacy you reduce. Arm, tone and 
receive individual counseling. After your free 
treatment and figure analysis, we will tell you 
where you’ll lose, how many treatments you’ll 
need and exactly how much it will cost you for 
your figure correction. For 30 years our exclusive 
program has achieved total figure correction for 
all ages.
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Loeffler asks repeal of 
10% interest-dividend tax

Congressman Tom Loef­
fler today introduced legis­
lation to repeal the automa­
tic withholding of 10% of 
interest and dividend in­
come.

This automatic withhold­
ing provision was part of the 
Tax Equity and Fiscal Re­
sponsibility Act of 1982 
which Congress approved 
last August.

“ I opposed the 1982 Tax 
Act and have consistently 
opposed withholding taxes in 
all my years in Congress,” 
said Loeffler following intro­
duction of his bill. ‘‘As you 
know, the 10% withholding 
of interest and dividends will 
not actually take effect until 
July, 1983. We in Congress 
have both the opportunity 
and the responsibility to 
repeal this provision quickly 
and spare our citizens and 
businesses the bureaucratic 
nightmare this legislation 
will undoubtedly cause.”

Loeffler called the with­
holding tax provision an af­
front to honest taxpayers, 
pointing out that ‘‘the IRS 
already has the mechanism, 
if not the will, to collect taxes 
due on interest and dividend 
income.”

‘‘Right now, each and 
every American who receives 
interest income receives a 
Form 1099 annually stating 
total amounts received. An 
identical Form 1099 is filed 
with the IRS. If the IRS is 
currently disregarding the 
information already reported 
in Form 1099,1 see no reason 
to collect the same informa­

tion through automatic with­
holding.”

A 1981 IRS study indi­
cates in fact that when the 
IRS is given information such 
as a Form 1099, there is 
voluntary compliance of 
96.7% without withholding.

‘‘In effect, under the new 
withholding provision, tax­
payers are not being permitt­
ed to keep their own money 
to use as they see fit until 
their tax bill officially comes 
due on April 15,” Loeffler 
added. ‘‘This is the most 
unfair and insiduous effect of 
the entire provision.”

Loeffler called for swift 
passage of his bill.

Use of wood products 
to increase in future

Use of wood products will 
continue to increase for the 
next 30 years although wood 
use currently is slack due to a

eW E
U IL

SELL
delWer

CUSTOM HOMES

The very best construction 
ot the lowest possible price.

SPKIALIZING IN HOMS ADDITIONS 
AND RSMODELING.

TOWN & COUNTRY
HOME BUIIOERS of SAN ANGUO

1020 Nm A  liTWt M«0.

(9 1 5 )6 5 8 -6 0 5 3

ME
AN OFFER

It'S That Time 
of Year!

We've got to clean out our existing stock to make 
ready fo r dozens of new homes on order. THIS IS 
NOT A SALE TO MISS!

NO REASONARLE OFFER WILL BE REFUSEO!

1 4 x 7 2  R I V I E R A
2 Bedroom 2 both cathedral ceilirtg 

^ireploce cetling fon stereo shingle roof

WAS................... $26,995
THEN...............  $25,995
THEN...............  $24,995

NOW MAKE ME AN OFFER

j . - l l i '

1 4 x 7 2  R I V E R I A
2 bedroom 2 both cathedral ceiling 

ceiling fan stereo shingle roof.

WAS................... $26,995
THEN...............  $25,995
THEN...............  $24,995
NOW MAKE ME AN OFFER

THESE MUST BE SOLD!
NEW HOMES FROM $9,995
•nyTtting o( accepted as down payment

YOU NAME 
TNE PRICE!

Everything goes!

Brecks, Redmans, 
Libertys, Melodys, 
Tidw ells, Riviera 
and more!

DISCOUNT HOMES OF SAN ANCELO
2502 N . B r y a n t  t H w y .  87) 658-3760

SA M M Y fA R M ER 'S  PLACE  658-3344

slowdown in the housing 
industry.

‘‘Use of wood products will 
not only increase domesti­
cally, but exports to foreign 
countries should improve,” 
says Dr. Mike Walter- 
scheidt, forestry specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

The U.S. exported more 
than $3.5 billion in wood 
products in 1981, he notes. 
According to United Nations 
studies, world wood demand 
for other than fuel will doub­
le by the year 2000.

Primary world markets will 
be western Europe and Ja­
pan, with other potential 
markets in the Middle East 
and Caribbean area, notes 
Walterscheidt, The Euro­
pean market is expected to 
increase dramatically as 
wood use increases in hous­
es. Most houses now are of 
masonry construction.

Japan currently accounts 
for about half of all U.S. 
wood product sales abroad.

Asian demand for U.S. 
wood products should contin­
ue to rise because the ready 
source of southeast Asian 
woods is being drastically 
curtailed, notes the specia­
list.

‘‘The U.S. can be expected 
to meet increased world de- 
man^- for wood products r 
because it has large^'-forest-i- .i j-ja ,i 
resources,” says W alter«, of n<:-. 
Scheldt.

This nation boasts 488 
million acres of commercial 
forest land compared to 700 
million acres in Canada and 
1.9 billion acres in Russia.
However, U.S. forest growth 
per acre far exceeds Canada 
and Russia, with total growth 
double that of Canada and 
nearly equalling that of Rus- ' 
sia, the specialist points out.

‘The southern U.S., in­
cluding Texas, is in an 
eviable position as far as 
total worldwide wood pro­
duction is concerned.” says 
Walterscheidt. ‘‘We have 
some of the best growing 
conditions and most accepted 
timber species. Timber is 
and will continue to be a 
good investment opportun­
ity.” _______

CARD OF THANKS
1 would like to thank 

everyone for all the tele­
phone calls and visits I re­
ceived while I was in the 
Tospital. 1 would also like to 
thank everyone for the beau­
tiful floral arrangements and 
the gifts I received. A spec­
ial thank you goes to Dr.
Carlisle and the hospital 
nursing staff for making my 
stay as pleasant as possi­
ble.

Thank you,
Mary E. Hill

49-ltp

CONGRESS WAISTS A PIECE OF YOUR SAVINGS.

W H A T  T H E Y

Y O U R  M IN D
Recently, Congress quietly passed a withholding law that will cost American savers and 
investors the use of 10% of their interest and dividends.

In simple terms, elective July 1st, 1983, this new law requires banks and other financial 
institutions to deduct 10% of the interest or dividends you earn on your savings and 
investments. That money then goes to the Internal Revenue Service in much the same way as 
payroll deductions are now handled.

The sponsors of this law have told us it was designed to catch a small minority of 
Americans who evade taxes on their interest and dividends. But the truth is the law penalizes 
the great majority of America’s savers and investors who pay their taxes faithfully. What’s 
more, the federal government is now receiving all the necessary information to curtail tax 
cheating.

Though the law does include exemptions for some low income and elderly Americans, if 
they go through the red tape of filing an application, most savers and investors will forfeit 
some of the money they could earn in compounded interest.

We urge you to join our efforts by writing letters to your representative in Congress and 
to the two senators from this state. Tfell them you want the 10% withholding tax repealed, 
because it would impose an unfair penalty on savers like yourself.

For assistance in contacting your representative and senators please ask any of our 
bankers. If we all act now. Congress will get a clear message from the voters back home, and 
they will work to repeal this needless law.

1,̂  /of̂ ;
xi'inm ff-.

NOW SERVING
Plate Lunches

daily except Wednesday
Beginning at 11:00 a.m.

' ■ -I-

Choice of Entrees
Choice of Vegetables

dessert and drink
Different Menu daily

EL CHATO’S

Npxt, The Federal Government 
Going Ib  Withhold Taxes 

Froih Your Savings And Interest

By William H. Kennedy, Jr.
Chairman of the Board 

National Bank of Commerce 
Pine Bluff, Arkansas
President, American 
Bankers Associatiori

The Federal 
government says 

that its purpose in 
raiding your  ̂

savings is to crack 
down on tax 

cheaters. Let's look 
at thefacts. 7 )

E ffective July 1. 1983. all financial 
institutions making interest and 
dividend pajanents will be required 

to withhold 10% to apply against your 
federal tax obligations.

As a result, savers and investors will lose 
the use of billions of dollars each year.

The federal government says that Its pur­
pose In raiding your savings is to crack 
doum on lax cheaters. Let s look at the facts.

The Internal Revenue Service recently 
reported an overall taxpayer compliance rate 
of between 85% and 90% for all interest and 
dividend payments. Wht?re a match ttp of 
the annual 1099 forms (Record of Informa­
tion Flimished to the Internal Revenue Ser­
vice) are made against actual interest and 
dividend tax reporting, compliance is esti­
mated to be in excess of 95%.

Under (he same new la\  ̂the government 
will be requiring all financial institutions to 
greatly e.xpand the 1099 reporting process to 
include virtually all savings instruments 
that have never been reported before. Con­
sequently. the IRS will soon have all the 
information needed to enforce almost 100% 
compliance. This is why we believe the 10% 
withhoUling to be entirely unncccssarx' and 
very' unwise with the economy in the sliape 
(hat it's in today.

Klirlhermorc. the IRS records show that 
about three-fourths of individual tax 
returns end up with refunds. Obviously, 
most of the money withheld from savers 
would be ultimately refunded,

Why Ihciii is the government Intent on 
going ahead with its plan? f

Quite simply, it lscreatingam (|^lainof 
unproductive paperwork and a^jneonve- 
nience to yoû —so that it will hav*he use of 
your money as an interest-free loan.

How will this affect you as an Individual? 
Let's say you are due a S200 interest pay­
ment after July, and you plan to leave it in 
your bank to grow through Interest com­
pounding. Under the new law. you will only 
have the use of. or be able to access $180 of 
your money. The other $20 will be sent to the 
IRS. Even If the government docs return 
your $20 months later as part of a lax 
refund, you will have lost the additional 
interest you could have been making on it. if 
it had been left in the bank.

There are more iHfa) just the financial

considerations at stake, however. Consider, 
for example, how this law could change your 
relationship with your bank.

Most f>eople consider their relationship 
with their banker a highly private affair. 
They can conduct the details of their finan­
cial lives iii confidence. Your banker, like 
your doctor, or your lawyer, believes that 
maintaining this relationship of privacy, 
trust, and confidence Is an ethical respon­
sibility.

The new withholding law will violate this 
relationship by permitting an authority to 

-•draw money Tight out of your Recounts. It 
represents yet another attempt by the 
federal government to force its way into your 
everyday life.

With banks already providing the IRS 
with the information necessary to track 
down the small percentage of (x ople who fail 
to report their Income from interest and div­
idends. we propose that the IRS direct their 
efforts towards doing a more comprehen­
sive matching of the data provided by banks 
to the tax returns of individuals. This will 
surely uncover anyone trying to evade the 
law.

Yet. the government seems to be resist­
ing this fair and equitable solution.

>lt comes down to the question, should 
honest taxpayers be required to give up 

•' Some of their rightful income from savings 
and investing because the government Is 
unwilling to use administrative procedures 
to find the few who cheat?

We. the members of the American Bank­
ers Association, do not think so.

We oppose allowing the federal govem- 
inen t to stand over your bank teller so that H 
can reacVi directly into your bank accounts.

We are act ively urging Congress to recon­
sider. and repeal this misguided and wrong 
attempt to impose a hidden tax on your sav­
ings.

We know that we cannot be successful in 
our battle on this issue without the help of 
millions of concerned Americans. This is 
why we are urging our customers to write 
their Congressmen and Senators.

The government wants a piece of your 
savings. Instead, give Congress a piece of 
your mind.

C O v itC -L .

Ozona National Bank
This advertisement written and sponsored by American Bankers Association

If you agree with these comments, 

please come in and sign a petition to that effect.
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Supper 
bridge club 
meeting

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Baggett 
and Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
Miller were hosts for the 
Supper Bridge Club Tues­
day, January 25, at the Civic 
Center.

Mr. and Mrs. C. 0 . Walk­
er won high and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Dudley were sec­
ond. Mr. and Mrs. L. D. 
Kirby won bingo.

Others attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Oscar Kost, Mr. 
and Mrs. Evart White, Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Carson, Mr. 
and Mrs. O. D. West, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Kirby, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Perry, Mrs. 
Arthur Kyle and Mrs. Rob­
ert Cox.

THE TRIAL OF MOTHER GOOSE was presented by Mrs.
Kirby’s third grade Thursday and Friday mornings for 
parents and friends at Ozona Intermediate School. The

Family structures changing
Family structure is chang­

ing and grandparents often 
aren’t as close physically or 
emotionally to grandchildren 
as in the past.

“There are several factors 
that operate against mean­
ingful ongoing interaction

KAYE THOMPSON 
Bride-elect of 

Jay Hufstedler 
NAN KEIFER 
Bride-elect of 

R. J. Everett HI
LIDA TILLMAN 

Bride-elect of 
Michael Scharton

fhave made bridal selections 
at

tBROWN FURNITURE 
COMPANY

between grandparents and 
adolescents,” says Dee Ste- 
gelin, family life specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Today’s society focuses on 
the nuclear family, she ex­
plains, which does not in­
clude grandparents. Also, 
grandparents and their adult 
children have developed a 
“ hands o ff’ attitude where 
neither is allowed to inter­
fere in the life of the other.

“The result is that many 
grandparents have no real 
attachments to their grand­
children,” reports Stegelin.

“ Another constraint in the 
relationship is that young 
people are likely to spend 
more time with peers and 
less with family members,” 
Stegelin says.

Yet close grandparent-ad­
olescent relationships can re­
sult in a stronger family unit. 
‘ ‘ The grandparent-teenager 
relationship is reciprocal,” 
Stegelin comments.

Today grandparents are

entire reading class took part in the play and had speaking 
parts.

BE A GOURMET
What does it take to be a 

“gourmet” -time and money 
difficult gourmet recipes, or 
special recipes? According to 
Mary Sweeten, key to being 
an outstanding cook is the 
ability to flavor any food 
creatively, subtley and suc­
cessfully.

Learn to enjoy cooking, 
experimenting and tasting. 
By adding each ingredient a 
small amount at a time and 
tasting after each addition, 
you can turn plain food into a 
gourmet treat, she adds.

healthier and better educa­
ted than in the past. They are 
now able to enjoy shared 
activities with their grand­
children. Equality in family 
relationships means, she 
adds, that grandparents to­
day are less authoritarian 
and can provide more emo­
tional support for their teen­
age grandchildren.

“Young people need to 
understand their family past 
so they share traditions, 
rituals and family history 
with grandparents,” says 
Stegelin.
DUPLICATE BRIDGE

Winners in Duplicate 
Bridge Club play Saturday at 
the Country Club were Mrs. 
Gene Williams and Mrs. 
John Childress. Mr. and 
Mrs. Evart White were sec­
ond.

In play Sunday, Evart 
White and Mrs. Bill Bag­
gett won the top spot, and 
Mrs. Robert Cox and Mrs. 
Buddy Phillips were second.

Letters to 
the Editor

Jannary 31,1983
Dear Editor,

I would like to make a 
sincere apology to Stan Lam­
bert, the directors and any­
one else connected with 
Crockett County National 
Bank.

I inadvertently left the 
Crockett County National 
Bank’s name off the list of 
new members of the Cham­
ber of Commerce, announced 
at the Annual Banquet, 
Thursday night.

I’m sorry for the mistake 
and I’ll try not to let it 
happen again.

Sincerely,
Beth Boyd
Manager Chamber of
Commerce

SPECIAL
,  / / ,  ^  /  / / /  <

WEST TEXAS BARBECUE
Every Friday

Begin serving at 6:00 p.m.

All the trimmings and all you can eat

M.95
O ZO N A STEAK HOUSE

OZONA INN OF THE WEST

Pr e p o r t  o f  co n d itio n

Consolidating domestic subsidiaries of the

OZONA NATIONAT. RANK
Of a tn k

of. m s m ..
City

TEXAS at the dose of business on DECEMBER 3 1In the state o f_____
published in response to call made by Comptroller of tha Currency, under title 12, United States Code, Section 161.

.,1982

Charter number. 7748 National Bank Region Number. 1 1 .

Statement of Resources and Liabilities Thousands of dollars

if)
1“
LU
if)
if)
<

if)

H
d

<

Cash and due from depository' institutions T . . . . 1 , ."ff.  ,, . . .-■r 4 , 3 9 4
U. S. Treasurv securities .......................................................................................................................... 1 m  n
Obligations of other U .S . Government agencies and corporations.................................................................. ______3 ..,4 3 .6 ____
Obligations of States and political subdivisions
in the United States .................................................................................................................
All other securities ....................................................................................................................
Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell

Loans, Total (excluding unearned income).....................................................| 26
Less: Allowance for possible loan lo sses ........................................................|_______
Loans, N e t.....................................................................................................................................

Lease financing receivables.....................................................................................................

M l .
239

■lQ-,.5.9-7..
ljQ_

3.800

Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises
Real estate owned other than bank p rem ises............................................................... ....................
All other assets ............................................................................................................................... ...................
TOTAL A S S E T S .......................................... ....... ................................................................................................
Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships,
and corporations.......................................................................................... .........................................................
Time and savings deposits of individuals, partner­
ships, and corporations .....................................................................................................................................
Deposits of United States Government....................................................................................................
Deposits of States and political subdivisions in
the United States...................................................................................................................................................
All other deposits...................................................................................................... ..........................................
Certified and officers' checks ...................... .................................................................................................
Total Deposits ................................................ ..................................................

26,382
- 0 -

760
2,893
U 1 9 1

5 4 . 3 9 5

1 X 1 1 1 6 ___ i

29,571
M r .

15.070
x O w

Total demand deposits....................................................................... .................
Total time and savings deposits............... .................................. .................

Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase...............
Interest-bearing demand notes (note balances) issued to the U .S . Treasury and other
liabilities for borrowed m oney............................................................................................................................
Mortgage indebtedness and liability for capitalized le a s e s .............................................................
All other liabilities ............................................................................................................■.......................................
TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures)......................................
Subordinated notes and debentures...................................................................................  ....................

3 . 1 4 9
119
110.

46,167

- 0 -

47 B74

<

CL
<
o
>-

D
a
'jj
< r

I
<  I 
DCl 
O!
t iw

LU

Preferred stock 
Common stock

M r .
. M M - Q l
40,000

No. shares outstanding 
No. shares authorized 
No. shares outstanding

Surp lus...................................................................................................................................................
Undivided profits and reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves
t o t a l  EQUITY C A P IT A L ...........................................................................................................
TOTAL LIABILIT IES AND EQUITY C A P IT A L ........................................................ • • •

(par value)

(par value) 400
6C 0

T 7 5 2 1
6

5 4 , 3 9 5

Amounts outstanding as of report date:
Standby letters of credit, total..............................................................................................
Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000 or more ..........
Other time deposits in amounts of $100,000 or more .........................................

Average for 30 calendar days (or calendar month) ending with report date: 
Total deposits.................................................................................................................................

1 7 ^
T 5 T 5 5 i

-O '

We, the undersigned directors attest the correctness of this 
statement of resources and liabilities. We declare that it has 
been examined by us, and to the best of our knowledge and 
belief is true and correct.

PREMIERED FEB.I 6:30 CST
also showing Feb. 3, 6, 9, 12, 14, 19,
Ozona T.V. System ^3, 27 

Phone 392-3323

I W. P..SEAH0RN. III.
Name

________CASHIER____________
Title

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this 
Report of Condition is true and correct tiM fTe best of 
my knovviedc

Directors

January
Date
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Plant shade trees now
The time is at hand for 

planting shade trees.
Planting shade trees dur­

ing the winter season offers 
several distinct advantages, 
says a horticulturist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service.

“The root systems of win­
ter-planted trees develop and 
become well established be­
fore top growth starts in the 
spring,” says Everett Janne.

Bare-root trees as well as 
container-grown or balled- 
and-burlapped trees are suit­
able for winter planting.

Choose trees adapted to 
the iarea, Janne says, and 
avoid “fast growing trees” 
because they are brittle and 
short-lived.

He offers these guidelines 
for tree planting:

Dig the tree pit large 
enough to allow at least six 
inches clearance on all sides.

The diameter of the pit is 
generally one-and-a-half 
times more than the root 
ball.

Make the pit only as deep 
as the root ball.

Plant the tree the same 
depth as it grew in the 
nursery. The soil line is a 
discolored ring on the trunk.

Check the soil’s internal 
drainage by filling the hole 
with water. If it doesn’t seep 
out in 24 hours, the roots 
could suffer from lack of 
oxygen. To improve drain­
age, dig a trench away fi*om 
the bottom of th© pit and fill 
it two-thirds full of gravel. 
This lets excess water drain 
to a lower area.

Place the tree in the hole, 
handling only the ball. Nev­
er carry it by the trunk. 
Remove any containers be­
fore planting.

Fill the hole with a good

topsoil or prepared mixture 
of soil, sand and peatmoss or 
pine bark. Water thoroughly 
to settle the soil and elim­
inate any air pockets.

Don’t fertilize at planting 
time; wait until after grovkdh 
starts in the spring and ferti­
lize lightly.

Stake the newly planted 
tree to stabilize and protect it 
until the roots become es­
tablished.

Wrap or protect the trunk 
fi-om sunscald, drying winds, 
sand storms and borer at­
tacks.

Water thoroughly when­
ever the soil becomes mod­
erately dry.

With proper handling and 
care, winter-planted trees 
will get off to a good start in 
the spring, says Janne.

SALE PRICE 
INCLUDES:

•  Moving

•  Foundation

•  Central 
Heat & Air

• Septic Tank

•  W aters  
Plumbing

•  Hook-ups

TIRED of MOBILE HOME 
OR APARTMENT LIVING 

YOUR NEW HOME IS READY

3 BEDROOM HOMES STARTING $ 35 ,5 00
11 %  LOW INTEREST RATES A V A ILA B LE  12  %  RATES A V A ILA B LE
FOR 15 YEARS WITH F H A -V A  FOR 30 YEARS C O N V EN TIO N A L
FIN A N C IN G . FIN A N C IN G .

MOST MODELS CONTAIN •  CATHEDRAL CEILING •  FIRELPLACES 
•  ISOLATED MASTER BEDROOM • QUALITY CARPETS •  KENMORE APPLIANCES

SALE PRICE 
INCLUDES:

•  Moving

•  Foundation

•  Central 
Heat & Air

•  Septic Tonk

•  Water & 
Plumbing

.•  Hook-ups

OPEN
M -F 8-5 

Sat. 8 -12 R e  ADI B ilt H o m e s
EQUAL HOVS 
On>ORTUN

^ /B U IL D E R S  S E R V IC E  CO .
170 0  NORTH PARK (RIVER) DRIVE_________ SAN A N G E LO . T X . ms&

B |

NOTICE
We Have Added Some More Services To

Bobby’s 
Painting Service
(Cabinets) CARPENTRY IN GENERAL 

House Framing - House Re-modeling Additions -
Bathrooms - Kitchens - Carports - 

New Houses Built

ROOnNG
Woodshingles - Composition, Tile, Spanish,

Gravel Roof - Tin

MASONARY
Brick Laying - Block Hreplaces -
Plastering - Cement Work - Slabs - 
Driveways - Ceramic Tile - Tarazzo 

Floors For Patios & Sidewalks

We Also Sell Carpet 
With Professional Installation 

Turn Key Jobs
Free Estimates Phone 392-3183

You can prepare delectable macadamia nut cookie 
squares in about 10 minutes flat. The recipe below uses 
a prepared pie crust mixture pressed into a pan (it’s not 
necessary to roll it out), a quick filling using canned 
crushed pineapple, and a topping of elegant macadamia 
nuts from Hawaii. (They’re available these days at your 
local supermarket.) Macadamia Pineapple Squares are 
sumptuous served with after-dinner coffee. They’d also 
make a show-stopping contribution to a dessert party.

MACADAMIA PINEAPPLE SQUARES
1 package (9 oz.) pie crust mix
2 eggs, divided
1 can (20 oz.) crushed pineapple, 

drained
3/4 cup firmly-packed light brown sugar 
1/4 cup butter or margarine, melted 
2/3 cup chopped macadamia nuts

Preheat oven to 350 F. In a medium bowl place pie 
crust mix; stir in 1 beaten egg; mix well. Press into an 8- 
inch square baking pan. Top with pineapple. In a small 
bowl beat remaining egg; stir in brown sugar and butter. 
Pour over pineapple. Sprinkle with macadamia nuts. Bake 
until firm, 35 to 40 minutes. Cool on a rack. Cut into 
2-inch squares, y i e l d ; 16 squares

New service offered by 
Ag. Extension Service
For the latest crop and 

livestock information, call
“TOMI.”

TOMI (Telephone Outlook 
and Market Information) is a 
service provided by the Tex­
as Agricultural Extension 
Service, Texas A&M Univer­
sity System, to help farmers 
and ranchers stay abreast of 
commodity markets and ot­
her information which they 
can use in planning and 
managing their operations.

January topics focus on 
certain decision dates, cattle 
on feed, grain crop produc­
tion update, production in­
put price outlook, dairy and 
cotton updates, the 1983 
cattle inventory, and the hog 
and pig situation.

Information on these top- 
.ics is available by picking up 
the ^telephone and dialing 
713/834-TOMI, points out 
Billy Reagor, county Exten­
sion agent. The telephone 
system operates seven days a 
week, 24 hours a day.

Messages are prepared by 
Extension Service econom­
ists, using the latest availa­
ble information.

Joggers out 
in spite of 
cold weather

The Ozona Intermediate 
joggers are still jogging de­
spite the chilly weather and 
wet ground. Mrs. Abbott’s 
class of 5th grade students is 
still in the lead with 889 
miles. Rosario Ramos is still 
leading the girls with 68 
miles and Luis Rico has 168 
miles. Mrs. Debbie Glass­
cock is leading all 5th grade 
teachers with 41 miles.

Mrs. Macias’ 4th graders 
are leading all 4th grades 
with 2,074 miles. Leticia 
Dominguez has 198 miles 
and Fleet Worthington has 
207 miles. Mrs. Leticia Ma­
cias has 185 miles.

Mrs. Spiller’s and Mrs. 
Jacoby’s classes are still 
battling it out for the third 
grade lead. Mrs. Spiller’s 
class is still leading 1,693 
miles but Mrs. Jacoby’s is 
staying close with 1,663. 
Adrian Vargas has 158 miles 
and Janet McDaniel has 171.

The January schedule for 
TOMI is as follows:

Jan. 4-6, Hog and Pig 
Situation-Ernie Davis; Jan. 
7-10, Decision Dates In 1983- 
Ron Knutson; Jan. 11-13, 
Production Input Price Out- 
look-Forrest Stegelin; Jan. 
14-17, Grain Crop Produc­
tion Update-Ed Smith; Jan. 
18-20, Cattle On Feed Anal- 
ysis-Ed Uvacek; Jan. 21-24, 
Dairy Situation-Bud Schwart; 
Jan. 24-27, Cotton Update- 
Carl Anderson; Jan. 28-31, 
1983 Cattle Inventory-Ed Uv­
acek.

TOMI can help you with 
your decision-making, Rea­
gor says, and the informa­
tion is only a phone call 
away.

Three B 
to drill 
outpost

The Three-B Oil Co., Mon­
ahans, will drill an outpost 
and a stepout to the opener 
and lone producer of the 
Noelke, Southeast (Queen 
gas) field of Crockett Coun­
ty, SVi miles east of Iraan.

Both projects, in 4-Archer 
CSL, Abst. 1869, are sched­
uled to 2,100 feet.

The No. 3 Shannon Dee, 
3/8-mile east, is 1,980 feet 
fi-om the north and 6,240 feet 
from the west lines.

The No. 4 Shannon Dee, 
5/8-mile southeast, is 3,960 
feet from the north and 6,900 
feet from the west lines.

The discovery, the No. 1 
Shannon Dee, was finaled 
May 14, 1980 for a calcu­
lated, absolute open flow of
570.000 cubic feet of gas 
daily, from open hole at 850- 
2,010 feet.

Anderson Petroleum Inc., 
Midland, No. 3-56A John 
Mitchell Estate “ A” , Can­
yon sand gas producer in the 
Ozona multipay field, 30 
miles southwest of Ozona, 
was finaled for a calculated, 
absolute open flow of
1.325.000 cubic feet of gas 
dailv.

Location is 983 feet from 
the north and 764 feet from 
the west lines of 56-MM- 
T&StL.

Boy Scouts 
assist

Boy Scout Troop 153, set 
up and arranged the tables at 
the Civic Center Thursday 
for the annual Chamber of 
Commerce banquet.

Boys taking part were 
Kenneth Sessom, Shawn 
Ballard, Joe Ross, Danny 
Guiterrez, Joe Hibler, Ricky 
Burger, Oscar Galindo, Rob­
bie Tambunga, Richard Var­
gas, Joe Perez, Gary Perez, 
J. J. Baker, George Wall, 
Shane Cooper, Keith Fowler, 
Carlos Galindo, Peter Shack- 
lette, Jason Montgomery, 
Jene Wilton, Jene Wilton, 
Jr., Lance Keilers and Trav­
is Burks.

Remember Now 
So You Can 

Remember Then.
A Professional

8 X10 Color Portrait 
For 88 Cents

All ages welcome - babies, adults, and 
families! Choose from our selection of 

scenic and color backgrounds. We’ll select 
poses, and additional portraits will be 

available with no obligation.
One 88<i portrait per subject or group. Backgrounds may 

occasionally change. Minors must be accompanied by a parent.

THESE DAYS ONLY  
February: Thur. Fri. Sat.

3 4 5
DAILY: 10 am. - 8 pm.

SATURDAY: 10 am. - 5 pm.

910 11th STR E E T, OZONA

PHONE NEWS TO 
OZONA STOCKMAN.

RfSTAURANT
Now Serving Daily
NOON SPECIALS 

Choice of two Entrees’ 
Vegetables 

Homemade rolls & Desserts
includes iced tea or coffee

ALSO SERVING EVERY SUNDAY
______Turkey and Dressing

Closec/
on

Tceesefĵ S
^̂ <1906

902 AVE. E 
OZONA, TEXAS

CONVENIENT 
WAYS TO BUY:

♦UNITED CHARGE 
♦LAYAWAY _  
♦VISA
♦MASTERCARD

DEPARTMENT STOR
Inventory

Clearance
Super Sovingt on Fashions

Ladies long Coats

Sale

WOOL BLENDS..POLY/COTTON, 
ZIP-OFF LINING

values to ^89’® $4088
Junior, leather 

Jackets
reg.»129”  $ ^ ^ 8 8

Ladies Jackets
values to 3̂9̂ ^

«*29“
G irl's O iots

values to

*12“ ..*32“
Men's Jackets

BEST OF THE I^ASON

values to 8̂9̂ ^

*26“ ..*49“
Boy's Jackets

values to ^39’*

*8“ t.*29“

For the Entire Family

Men's Levi Jeans
soli FLAIRS < 1  r  8 8
IN DENIM

Men's Seaters
values to ^16*’

Ladies Biouses
values to 2̂2̂ ’

*2“ ..*8“
Ladies Dresses

values to ^32’^

*8“ ..*18“
G iri's Dresses

values to ^19’®

$ ^ 8 8 to $ |2 8 8
Children's Shoes

values to 1̂5̂ ®

Lodies Shoes
. CASUAL...DRESSY ^  #  QO

values to ^24’® ^ 0  
Um ted...'% here quality merchandise Is sold at affordable prices.'
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For Sole

FOR SALE-Farm, ranch, 
business and home storage, 
7x8 to 14x48 stock buildings 
and larger custom. Heavy 
duty steel. We deliver. Mor­
gan, 3220 Sherwood Way',u 
944-8696. 34-tfc

5% DOWN, good, bad, or 
little credit required. Owner 
financing available. 50 
homes to choose from. Call 
Ron or Lanny for appoint­
ment. 381-7200. 47-4tc

FOR SALE-Cab over camper 
sleeps 4. Butane bottle-2 
burner stove-ice box. Fair 
condition. Reasonable price. 
Also camper shell for 8 ft. 
bed pickup. Call 392-3533 
after 6 p.m. 49-2tp

Repos, Repos, Repos-13 V2%
interest, 5% down. Owner 
financing. For appointment 
call Mr. James or Mr. Bur­
nett at 381-7201. 47-4tc

FOR SALE-New Fleetwood 
Mobile Home, 14x70 located 
in Sonora, 510 Crockett, nev­
er lived in, 2-br. 2-bath, 
wood siding, shingle roof, 
storm windows, extra insula­
tion, good carpet, dishwash­
er, 3Vi ton air. Call Buster, 
915/387-2373 . 48-5tc

FOR SALE-Green Houses, 6 
ft.X8 ft. with storm door and 
vent. New const.-lumber and 
fiberglass. Other size by 
order. Call 392-3296 or see at 
212 Ave. M. Will deliver.

48-2tp

FOR SALE-One, 2 bedroom 
and one 3 bedroom mobile 
home. Owner will carry pa­
pers. Call 333-3928 for ap­
pointment. Sa Habla Espano.

48-4tc

FOR SALE-Repos-2 and 3 
bedrooms. Good, little or no 
credit. Low monthly pay­
ments. We can put you in the 
home of your choice. Call 
333-4774 for appointment. Sa 
Habla Espano. 48-4tc

FURNITURE FOR SALE-
Couch, chairs, bedroom 

-suite, dinette, tables. Call 
"’392-2283 after 5. 49-ltp

KHAYGRA2aSR HAYfor sale. 
Qin the barn $2.00 and $2.50. 

In field stack, $1.50. 16 mile 
west of Menard, Walter Rus­
sell, 915-396-2532, Box 933, 

'M enard, 76859. 41-tfc

\\;C LO G G ED  P IP E S , 
D R A IN S , S E W E R S
NOdigging NOdamage

Raul DeLaRosa
PIvmbing & Senr. 

Ditch Digging 
Pfc. 392 2726 
1206 Ave. F.

Help Wonted

SITTER WANTED in our
home, for 2 pre-schoolers, 6 
p.m. to 8:30 p.m. week­
days, part time Saturday and 
Sunday. Call 392-2341. 48-tfc

THE OZONA STOCKMAN WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 2, 1983

NEEDED-Front help, cook 
and dishwasher for Red 
Apple. Good benefits and 
added bonuses. Apply to 
J.B. Miller at Firestone 
store. 27-tfc

IMMEDIATE OPENING 
For full-time infant 

18 months or younger
Drop-Ins welcome till posi­
tion is filled. Ozona Day Care 
Center, 2-3641. 46-tfc

FOR SALE-1979 ’98 Olds 
Regency. Excellent condi­
tion. Phone 392-3323 or 
392-3257. 48-tfc

HELP WANTED-Waitress- 
es, apply in person at El 
Chato’s Restaurant. 46^tfc

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
meets each week 

on Monday at 8 p.m. 
Methodist Church

40-tfc

FOR SALE-1978 Chevy 
V2-ton pickup. Call 392-2011.

48-tfc

FOR SALE-Kimball Elec- 
,tronic Entertainer Organ. 
Like new with bench and 
music books. Ph. 392-2836. 

£ 49-ltp

NEEDED-Shaklee Products 
Distributor-Great Opportu­
nity with all benefits. Phone 
387-3947, Sonora. 41-tfc

STOP SMOKING GUM helps 
you conquer nicotine craving 
in one day. Money back 
guarantee. Clayton’s Village 
Drug.

41-tfc

Gorage Soles

GARAGE SALE-Friday, Feb. 
4, 9:00-4:00. #27 Crockett 
Heights. 49-ltp

Miscellaneous

EVERYONE LIKES POL­
LY’S YUMMY CAKES and
red heart cookies. Call early 
to get orders filled. Polly’s 
Cakes, 211 Mesquite, 
392-3129. 49-2tc

DEER LEASE WANTED for
1983 season. 8-12 hunters, 
call A.J. Smith at 713- 
865-5191/713-865-5052.

46-6tp Real Estote

SEE Duke Owens at Mus­
tang Chevrolet in San Angelo 
for new and used car needs. 
11.9% on all new cars.

45-tfc

HAVE YOU ORDERED A 
PERSONALIZED CAKE for
the loved one in your life? 
Call Polly for a delicious and 
beautiful cake with a mes­
sage. Phone 392-3129, 211 
Mesquite, Polly’s Cakes.

49-2tc

For Rent

OFFICE SPACE FOR RENT-
Contact Steve Wilkins at 
392-3491. 42-tfc

FOR SALE-Three bedroom 
ranch-style home, 2 years 
old, 2‘/j baths, large fenced 
lot. 392-5841 (day) 392-5047 
(evening). 47-3tp

SEWING IN MY HOME-
Specializing in western 
shirts. Also mending and 
alterations. Phone Linda Ses- 
som at 392-2171. 50-3tc

FOR RENT-2400 ft. ware­
house, insulated. With office 
240 sq. ft. Phone 392-3625. 
After 6 call 392-2053. 35-tfc

NOW OPEN-Ozona Flea 
Market & Second Hand 
Store, 1100 Blk. Ave. G. 
Tables and spaces available. 
Buy-sell-trade flea market 
Friday, Saturday and Sunday 
8:00 a.m. till. Second hand 
store open Monday thru Sat­
urday. For more information, 
call 392-2834. We take con­
signments.

48-tfc

FOR RENT-$250 month-— 
Furnished-1 bedroom apt. 
and furnished 2 bedroom 
apartment. Call 392-3367 af­
ter 5 p.m. 46-tfc

ACREAGE FOR SALE-150 
Acs. Hunting-$175 per acre. 
5% down, 15 years owner 
financing at 9%%. Watering 
hole for big deer, javelina, 
and quail. Call 1-800- 
292-7420. 47-3tp

Used Cars

w  JESSE m  
Tire Repair

Shop
corner of Ave. 

H & 5th St. 
FUILTIMF 

ROAD SERVICE
7 a.m. to 12 p.m.

Notice ofi

REWARD
S'
},!I am offering

*500 Reward
~ for i4>prehension and convic- 
' tion of guilty parties to every 

theft of livestock in Crockett 
County - except that no 

; officer of Crockett County 
may claim the reward.

‘ Sheriff, Crockett Co.

Biffy Mitts

JEEP COMMANDER 4X4-
Reg. miles 22,000. Air Con­
ditioner, radio, cassette, 5 
snow grip tires, puncture 
proof tubes. $5,500. Call 
392-3367. 49-tfc

FOR SALE-1972 Ford Grand 
Torino, $500. Corner of 4th & 
G. 392-3104. 49-2tp

FORD MUSTANG-Cobra II 
for sale. Call after 5 p.m. 
392-3417. 49-ltp

HAYES
AUTO

REPAIR
Mechanic On Duty 

8a.m.-6p.m. 

1311 Ave. AA 

Phone 392-3224

A Friendly Reminder
Your Bank Offers:

1. New safety  deposit boxes

2. Variable rate IRA's (good for 
1982 tax deductions)

3. Money M arket Accounts

and most im portantly personnel that will 

help satisfy  all your financial needs

Phon* 392-2676, 392-2694, 392-3787

Ozona National BankFDMMember of
Main Bank to 12 and 1 to 3 
Motor Bank-8 o.m. to 5 p.m.

Business Services
FOR YOUR Rinsenvac 
Qeaner come to South Texas 
Ijunber Co. 30-tfc

Pete W. Jacoby
Real Estate

P h. 3 9 2 -3 0 5 9  

H om es-L ots-C om m ercia l 
R anch  Properties

* 401 Hillcrest

ZAPATA TAX SERVICE -
1703 Walnut. Weekdays, 10 
a.m. to 6 p.m. Reasonable 
rates, prompt. 48-5tp

DECORATED CAKES and
cookies for special occasions. 
Call PoUy at 392-3129. 39-tfc

I

FOR SALE-Three bedrooms, 
two baths, central heating 
and cooling by gas, insula­
ted, new plumbing and car­
pet. Carport, utility building, 
lots of room. Call 392-3067 or 
392-3238. 27-tfc

ATTENTION
Singer Sewing Machine 

repairman will be at the 
Ozona Inn of the West, 
Thurs., Feb. 3, 10 a.m. till 8 
p.m. Fri. Feb. 4, 8 a.m. to 
noon, doing in-home repairs 
on all brands. Call 392-2663 
now for appointments.

47-3tc

MOBILE HOMES moved. 
Phone 392-2351. 27-tfc

WE BUY DEER HIDES AND 
PECANS-Beginning Dec. 1 
we will be buying furs., 
Contact Glenn Sutton, 1103 
Aye. H. 38-tfc

BLACK DIRT, caliche hauled 
and right-of-ways built. Ph. 
392-2351. 27-tfc

FOR SALE-Very clean, very 
comfortable, with many ex­
tras is this three bedroom, 
one bath home. Central heat, 
refrigerated air, nice den, 
fenced yard, located in nice 
family neighborhood. Shown 
by appointment only. 
392-2208. 29-tfc

CECIL WESTERMAN 

Would

Be 
YOUR
PHARMAaST 

PH 392-2608

INTEREST RATES ARE 
THE LOWEST THEY 
HAVE BEEN !N TWO 
YEARS. NOW IS THE 
TIME TO BUY.

NICE DEN ^ i t h  fire­
place air and
heat. ^M >dr., 1 bath. 
Reduced!
N E A '5 ^ ^ |j0 v ith  furn­
is h in g
AUSTIN STONE-3 bdr., 3 
bath.
SPACIOUS 4 bdr., IVi 
bath with fenced yard. 
RENT PROPERTY for 
sale.
CROCKETT HEIGHTS-
3 bedroom, 1 bath-fenced 
yard. Freshly painted 
inside.
1979, 14X74-2 bdr. mo­
bile home-excellent con­
dition.
TOUSE to be moved.

OUT OF TOWN 
PROPERTY
BARNHART-Seller of 
appro. 8 acres says re­
duce & sell. Will finance.

If you have any Real 
Estate need [buying or 
selling, large or small,] 
please contact me. I may 
not have all the answers, 
but I wlU certainly try to 
belp you.

Thank yon,
JOHNNY CHILDRESS 

1102 Ave. E 
392-3634

Steve Stewart Realtor

j JA Y  MILLER |
iC O N S T R V C n O N  CO ]
A General D irt Contractor I
V ¥7 * I  I  ^  AOil Field Contracting |

R oads, Locations, Pits ^
1 D ozers, D um ptrucks, M aintainers aI ’. Airplane Service Available k 

J 392-3243 Phone 3 9 2 -24391

JOHNNY CHILDRESS!
392-3634

Hunting Leases 
Exotic Hunts

Gulf Products 
Groceries

6:00 A.M. to 10:00 P.M.

Exotic Game 
Sporting Goods

WHITE HOUSE COMPANY
P.O. BOX 478 

OZONA, TEXAS 76943 
(915) 392-2850 - HOME 

(915) 392-3912 - O FFIC E
%

PORTABLE WALK-IN COOLERS 
SOLAR POWERED WILDLIFE FEEDERS

DAVID H. WEANT 
OWNER

Homes
Ranches
Commerdol
Lots
Lake Prooertles 
Approisols

S t e v L  S t e w i [ r t j t e t l f i i r

Levon Parker

Tree Dozing - Raking & Seeding 
Right-a-way - 

Tanking - Fire Guards

P.O. BOX 582 
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

TELEPHONE
392-2206

Building - Remodeling - Painting 

Plumbing Repair - Electrical Repair

Cement Work - patios - Floors - Stem

Walls - Basements - Sidewalks 

Commercial or Residential 

20 Years Experience

Qyde “Red” Myatt

John R. Jones
Real Estate

39 2 -2 02 1  3 9 2 -2 1 1 3

Elizabeth Upham-Agent
3 9 2 -2 3 3 4

(Lots-Houses-Commercial)
'  COMMERCIAL BUILDING FOR RENT 

Excellent Location-Good Parking

^

L&D Gas & Groceries
*  Fiaa Gas
*  Groceries
*  Cigarettes

392-2602 Ozona, Texas

WIvve 
c a t s

And we'd love to keep 
pours in top condition^

Effective Feb. 1, 
we will accept 

Visa and Mastercard

Wookdays
Fina’s Quality Gas 
$119.9 Regular 
1.23.9 Unleaded

180c a pack
SKOAL mOPENHAGEN- 

75c can
'iHrs.: 5:30 a.m.-l:00 a .m ..
:!Open: 7 Days a Week ^

*  Ice
*  Toiletries
*  Ice Cream

WELCOME ALL
1108 Ave. J  Ozona, Texas 76943

8:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m.
Saturday

8:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. 
Tony’s Quik

Lube &
Tidy Car

fouy Fierro 392-3473
330 Ave. H. Ozona, Toxas

\


