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Cof  C
Banquet
Thursday

The 14th Annual Chamber 
of Commerce Banquet will 
get underway Thursday 
night at 7 p.m. at the Civic 
Center with registration, fol­
lowed by the meal at 7:30.

Tickets are $3.50 and may 
be purchased at the door.

Dean Rippetoe of Midland 
is the guest speaker and 
those in attendance are in for 
an entertaining evening. 
Dean is a former Ozonan and 
a former Ozona Chamber of 
Commerce president. He has 
a natural wit and style which 
has earned him the name of 
“ the Will Rogers of West 
Texas.” He is an interesting 
speaker as well as an enter­
taining one.

A drawing will be held for 
three door prizes. To be eligi­
ble for the prizes, a person 
must sign his or her name on 
the back of their ticket and 
deposit it in the box

The program this year will 
be dedicated to the late 
Hubert Baker, longtime 
Chamber of Commerce man­
ager and director.

Castro Asks 
Another Term 
In Free. 4

Chuy Castro, County Com­
missioner of Precinct 4, au­
thorized the Stockman to an­
nounce his candidacy for re- 
election to that post this 
week, subject to the May 6, 
Democratic Primary.

CHATTING WITH UONS CLUB MEMBERS before the 
weekly meal and meeting last Thursday is Nelson Wolff, 
right, candidate for the 21st U.S. Congressional District. Dr.
Joe Logan and Billy Reagor seem interested. Wolff was the 
speaker for the club Thursday. He has visited in Ozona

In Contest of Election Results-------

DeHoyos Adds 14 NamesTo 
Claimed Illegal Voter List

In making his announce­
ment, Castro said, “ Having 
served as your commissioner 
for the past three years, I feel 
that my experience, know­
ledge and honesty will en­
able me to work effectively 
for the best interests of the 
people in Precinct 4 and 
Crockett County.”

He continued, “ I have en­
joyed working for the people 
of Crockett County and if 
re-elected, I will continue to 
put my best efforts forth to 
do the best job I can.”

An amendment was filed 
in 112th District Court here 
this week in the contested 
election suit styled Soste- 
nes DeHoyos vs. Jesse Mar- 
ley, filed last Monday. The 
latest document was titled 
“ Contestant’s First Amend­
ed Original Petition.” It adds 
13 names to the 63 names 
which the first petition 
claims voted illegally in the 
election for commissioner of 
Precinct 3, and added to the 
suit as exhibit “ A” .

Originally 63 names were 
on the list and these names 
were published in last week’s 
paper as they appeared in 
the petition. However, the 
latest list deleted number 63, 
Fannie Sanchez, the former 
Fannie DeHoyos, and added 
fourteen more names. The 
names added are Louise 
Bean Appel, Jesus Aredon- 
do, Joe Tom Davidson III, 
Tana Blanton Davidson, 
John Coates, Catherine 
Coates, Fletcher Coates, 
George Curtis Cannon, Ann 
Rose Cannon, Randolf 
Mixon, Yvonne Mixon,

Funeral Services For 
Mrs. Moughon In Gilmer

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Barbara W. Moughon, 50, 
were held Friday at 3 p.m. at 
First United Methodist 
Church in Gilmer with bur­
ial in Gilmer City Cemetery 
under the direction of Croley 
Funeral Home.

Mrs. Moughon died 
Thursday morning in a Ty­
ler hospital after a brief 
illness.

She was born in Ozona 
October 24, 1927, the

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Evart White. She graduated 
from Ozona High School and 
was a 1949 graduate of 
Southern Methodist Univer­
sity. She earned her Mas­
ters of Education Degree 
from East Texas State Un­
iversity.

She was married to Sid 
Moughon June 18, 1948 in 
Ozona. They moved to Gil­
mer shortly after their mar­
riage and have resided there 
since. She was a member of 
the First United Methodist 
Church and on the faculty of 
the Gilmer Independent 
School System where she had 
taught high school English 
since 1966. Prior to that, she 
taught at a small commun­
ity near Gilmer for three 
years.

Survivors include her hus­
band, Sid, of Gilmer; two 
sons, Dan Moughon of Ar­
lington and Wes Moughon of 
Nacogdoches; one daughter, 
Mrs. Dinah Wade of Enid, 
Okla.; her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Evart White, and one 
sister, Mrs. Judy Ogilvy of 
Odessa.

Charles West, Mr. Bill 
Thornton and Mrs. Bill 
Thornton.

The suit, while filed 
against Marley, asks the 
court to set aside the elec­
tion results and declare De­
Hoyos winner of the elec­
tion, due to the list of voters 
claimed illegal, or to hold 
another special election, de­
claring those on the list in­
eligible to vote in precinct 1. 
Most of the names listed in 
exhibit “ A” are ranching 
families who have homes in 
town as well as on the ranch, 
but have always voted in 
their ranching precinct.

Members of the commun­
ity expressed feelings from 
dismay to anger after word of 
the law suit got around last 
week. County officials were 
sued after the 1976 run-off 
election for the same race 
which saw Marley the victor 
over DeHoyos. They were 
ordered by a federal court to 
return the precinct lines to 
those of pre-1974 and to hold 
a special election.

The new lines were drawn 
as before and the tax office 
worked months notifying the 
people who had been moved 
back to another precinct. 
This was especially difficult 
as there is no mail deliv­
ery route in Ozona and most 
people have only a post office 
box number in place of a 
residence address. However, 
this was done, and in a 
meeting with Kay Butler, a 
representative from the U.S. 
Justice Department, all can­
didates approved the voting 
list. Agreeing, in effect, that 
the candidate polling the 
most votes would be the 
winner of the election.

Marley won the run-off 
election by 32 votes. The bal­
lots were impounded after 
the Jan. 7 run-off election, 
and the suit contesting the 
election was filed Monday, 
Jan. 30. The first amend­
ment was filed Monday, Feb. 
6, and nobody knows at this 
point how many more 
amendments will be filed.

Marley was the only one 
involved to talk to the press. 
He said he had retained 
Charles Sherrill of Sonora 
and Lucious Bunton of Odes­
sa to defend him in the suit. 
He has been required to post 
a bond of approximately 
$35,000 within ten days. He

said he had been approached 
by several of his support­
ers with offers of assistance 
in paying the legal fees in­
volved, but that a fund for 
this purpose had been set up 
at the bank in order that he 
would not be personally in­
volved with any money col­
lected.

Marley said that accord­
ing to his lawyers, all per­
sons on the list attached to 
the suit as exhibit “ A” 
would be subpoenaed. He 
said, however, that those 
who are going to school or in 
the military stationed over 
100 miles from Ozona need 
not appear, according to 
opinion by his attorneys.

District Judge Troy Wil­
liams was automatically dis­
qualified from hearing the 
suit here in his home dis­
trict, but said he had been in 
touch with District Adminis­
trative Judge Ross Doughty 
of Uvalde, and he would be 
responsible for selecting a 
judge when the answer to the 
suit is filed by Marley’s 
attorneys. He said he has 

. tentatively set a criminal 
case for court here March 20, 
but since the suit in ques­
tion takes precedence over 
others, he feels that if every­
thing is in order the case will 
be tried at that time and he 
will fill in elsewhere for the 
judge who takes over the 
case here.

Services 
Tues. For 
Mrs. Longoria

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Tomasa O. Longoria, 88, 
were held Tuesday in Our 
Lady of Perpetual Help Cat­
holic Church with burial in 
Lima Cemetery under the 
direction of Sheppard Funer­
al Home.

Mrs. Longoria died Sun­
day after an illness. She was 
born Dec. 30, 1889 in Mex­
ico.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Mrs. Emma Cam­
arillo of Ozona and Mrs. 
Maximana Crujillo of Mexi­
co; a son, Francisco Cru­
jillo of Oklahoma City, Okla.; 
35 grandchildren and four 
great grandchildren.

Most Incumbents ForCounty 
Office To Run Unopposed

several times during the last months and will return to 
attend the Chamber of Commerce Banquet Thursday night. 
Wolff is one of the nine candidates in the race for retiring 
Congressman Bob Krueger’s seat. He was in the run-off 
with Krueger when Krueger won the seat.

Jones Files 
For Election 
To Judgeship

County Judge Johnny 
Jones has authorized the 
Stockman to announce his 
candidacy for the election to 
the office of County Judge of 
Crockett County.

Judge Jones was appoint­
ed to the office of County 
Judge Sept. 1, 1977 when 
Judge Troy Williams re­
signed the post.

Prior to his appointment 
Judge Jones was engaged in 
ranching and real estate in 
the county. A lifetime resi­
dent of Crockett County, he 
was graduated from Ozona 
High School in 1960, and 
graduated from Texas Tech 
University in 1964. A mem­
ber of the Methodist Church, 
Judge Jones has been active 
in community affairs having 
served on both the Crockett 
County school board and 
hospital boards.

Judge Jones is active in 
business and ranching in 
Crockett County. His wife 
Patti has a green house and 
flower shop which she oper­
ates here in Ozona. They 
have two children, Amy 10, 
and Todd 7.

“ I consider the office of 
County Judge to be an im­
portant and full time job. I 
believe I am a qualified and 
capable candidate, and if 
elected, I will serve to the 
best of my ability. Your 
support will be apprecia­
ted,” Judge Jones added.

Mrs. Miller 
Buried Here 
Sunday

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Will Miller, 91, were held 
Sunday afternoon at First 
Baptist Church with Rev. I.L. 
Whetsell, chaplain of Bapt­
ist Memorials of San Ange­
lo, officiating. Burial follow­
ed in Cedar Hill Cemetery.

Mrs. Miller died Friday 
morning in Baptist Memor­
ials Geriatric Hospital after 
an illness. She was born 
Sept. 2, 1886 in Ozona and 
was married to Will Miller, 
Feb. 20, 1906 in Ozona. She 
had been a resident of San 
Angelo for the past several 
years.

Survivors include a son, 
Morris Miller of San Angelo, 
a daughter, Mrs. Mildred 
Bond of Brooksmith; a sis­
ter, Mrs. Maggie Crawford 
of Ozona; seven grandchil­
dren, several great grand­
children ,

Filing deadline for state­
wide and county posts to be 
filled in the general election 
in November ended at 6 p.m. 
Monday. Several county 
posts come up this year, but 
the only candidates to file 
besides the incumbents were 
for commissioner. Precinct 2, 
where incumbent commis­
sioner Bill Black has two 
opponents. Bill T. Williams 
and Byron Stuart.

In Crockett County most 
interest will be focused on 
the Democratic Primary May 
6, since all candidates have 
filed with the Democratic 
Party chairman, and there is 
no opposition in the Novem­
ber election. However, there 
is a full slate of candi­
dates for state and nation­
al offices for the November 
election.

Locally, county offices to 
be filled include county 
judge, county treasurer, 
county clerk, county commis­
sioners, Precincts 2 and 4, 
and Justice of the Peace, 
Justice Precinct 1.

Incumbents filing include 
Johnny Jones for county 
judge. He was appointed to 
the post Sept. 1, by the 
Crockett County Commis­
sioners Court when Troy 
Williams resigned to accept 
the district judgeship, and 
will be asking for his first 
elected term of four years.

Also filing for re-election 
were Chuy Castro, commis­
sioner of Precinct 4, asking 
for his second elected term; 
Leta Powell for county clerk, 
Jim Dudley for county treas­
urer and A1 Fields for Jus­
tice of the Peace.

As of noon Tuesday there 
had been no word of an 
opponent for Judge Wil­
liams, who filed earlier for an

Legal Defense 
Fund Drive 
Is Underway

The Jess Marley Legal 
Defense Fund, a fund to de­
fray legal expenses and other 
costs incurred in the elec­
tion contest for Commission­
er Precinct 1, has been set up 
at the Ozona National Bank.

According to former Dis­
trict Judge Charles Sherrill 
and Attorney Lucious Bun- 
ton, Marley’s defense law­
yers, the fund is non-pol­
itical and contributions are 
not limited in amount.

Contributions to this fund 
will be accepted at the Ozona 
National Bank and all donors 
names will be kept con­
fidential.

elected term to District 
Judge, 112th District.

The full results of the 
filings for statewide and na­
tional offices were not known 
at noon Tuesday because 
mailed filing fees postmark­
ed before 6 p.m. Monday will 
be accepted by both the Re­
publican and Democratic 
State chairmen.

There is a host of hope­
fuls for Governor opposing 
Gov. Briscoe in his bid for a 
third term. They include 
Democrats Ray Allen Mayo, 
Preston Smith, John Hill and 
Donald Beagle, plus Repub­
licans Williams Clements, 
Ray Hutchison and Clarence 
Thompson. Filing with the 
secretary of state to run as 
independents in the Novem­
ber election for Governor 
include Lawrence A. Sims, 
John Solon, C. Leon Pickett 
and Richard A. Peterson. 
So, voters will have a wide

selection for Governor of the 
State of Texas.

The race for the 21st 
Congressional District seat 
being vacated by U.S. Rep. 
Bob Krueger will also field 
many candidates. So far nine 
have filed for the position. 
They include Nelson Wolff of 
San Antonio, who was in the 
run-off election with Kruger 
when he first won the post, 
who filed as a Democrat, 
Wallace Larson, Republican; 
Neil Calnan, Republican; 
Woodrow Glasscock, Jr., 
Democrat; Bobby Locke, Re­
publican; Tom Loeffler, Re­
publican; Paul Dahlgren, 
Democrat; Joe Sullivan, 
Democrat; Steve Clark, Dem­
ocrat.

U.S. Senator John Tower 
will not have a Republican 
opponent in his bid for re- 
election to the Senate, but 
will face either Joe Christi or 
Bob Krueger, Democrats in 
the general election.

Stuart Throws Elat In Ring 
For Commissioner Prec. 2 Job

Byron W. Stuart threw his 
hat in the ring for the post of 
Commissioner of Precinct 2, 
before the filing deadline 
Monday and authorized the 
Stockman to announce his 
candidacy. He will be run­
ning against incumbent com­
missioner Bill Black and 
candidate Bill T. Williams.

BYRON STUART
Stuart has lived in Pre­

cinct 2 since January 20, 
1936 with the exception of 
four years during the War. In 
announcing his candidacy, 
he said, “ I have no ax to 
grind with anyone, but I need 
the job and I feel my ex­
perience in business here in 
Ozona for so many years 
would be a benefit to the 
court.”

Stuart recently sold Stuart 
Motor Co. to Dub Carlisle. 
Carlisle took over manage­
ment Feb. 1, and Stuart has 
been staying on as service 
manager.

A Texas native, Stuart 
came here in 1935 as catcher 
for the Ozona Giants, a semi- 
pro baseball team. He mar­
ried Wanda Dunlap Jan. 20, 
1936. They continued to 
make Ozona their home 
while making the circuit of 
professional baseball during 
the season.

In 1945 he went to work for 
North Motor Co. where he 
worked for fifteen years be­
fore going into business for 
himself as Stuart Motor Co., 
a G M C dealer in 1960, 
where Crockett Automotive 
is now located. In January of 
1968 Stuart bought the Chry­
sler, Dodge, Plymouth Agen­
cy from Frank James, which 
is now Carlisle Motors.

Stuart has been active in 
almost every phase of com­
munity life in Ozona. He is a 
member of First Baptist 
Church and a charter mem­
ber of the Ozona Lions Club. 
He served on the school 
board for eight years in the 
late fifties and early sixties. 
He is a charter member of 
the Ozona Volunteer Fire 
Department and resigned 
last year after 30 years of 
service. He has been active 
for years in Little League 
baseball, serving for many 
years as manager and then 
as Umpire, which he still 
does during the season.

Stuart said he plans to see 
everyone in his Precinct be­
fore the Democratic Primary 
May 6, and earnestly soli­
cited their vote and support.

GETTING READY FOR THE ANNUAL Chamber of Commerce Banquet which will take 
place at the Civic Center Thursday night is chamber manager Joann Babbitt and director 
Beth Boyd. The girls were mixing business with pleasure or business with business Tuesday 
morning in the work room at Small Fashions making table decorations for the banquet. A 
Valentine theme will be carried out in decorations.
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DEFENSE OF CANAL 
KEY TO SENATE VOTE

By Edwin Feulner

It now appears evident that the Panama Canrl treaties 
will not be approved unless they are modified.

The key to the continuing controversy is the conflicting 
interpretations of America’s right to protect the canal after it 
is turned over to Panama.

Senate M inority Leader Howard Baker, Jr. (R- 
Tennessee), who may have the single most important vote 
in the Senate on the treaties, recently returned from a fact­
finding trip to Panama and said that he told Panamanian 
dictator General Omar Torrijos, that he saw “ no chance’’ 
that the treaties could win the required two-thirds Senate 
approval in their present form.

Senator Baker’s remarks and- the uneasiness of many 
Senators over the language of the treaties reflect the feelings 
of the majority of Arnerieans. As m  in-depth analysis of the 
treaties by a Heritage Foundation policy analyst concluded, 
“ At the fundamental level no convincing case has been 
presented that the new treaties can protect America’s vital 
security and economic interests better than the present 
treaty. Instead, the current confrontations with the 
Panamanian government may lead to a much broader range 
of conflict under the new treaty. But, once the treaties are 
ratified, the U.S. loses control over the Canal Zone, and 
thus most of her leverage in dealing with the Torrijos 
regime.’’

Other major problems posed by the treaties include:
1) A serious question as to whether the proposed 

jointly-run Panama Canal Commission, which will replace 
the Panama Canal Company, can continue efficient 
operation of the Canal.

2) The clause prohibiting the U.S. from negotiating 
with another nation to construct a new canal without 
Panama’s permission, and

3) The economic terms of the new treaties. The 
Panamanian government will receive under the new treaty 
provisions approximately $60 million a year, more than 
2500% above the present level of payments made by the 
United States. Since the payments will come out of canal 
operating expenses, tolls will have to be increased 25% to 
40% — the largest single toll increase in the history of the 
canal.

There are, quite frankly, no simple clarifications or 
restatements of the meanings of the language that can 
resolve these areas of concern.

The new treaties would transform the concept of the 
Panama Canal from its operation as a vital artery of world 
commerce into an enterprise designed to satisfy the 
economic and nationalistic desires of one nation.

Other considerations will certainly figure in the final 
decision of the Senate on ratification, but the specific terms 
of the treaty have raised rather than resolved prospective 
problems inherent in transferring the canal to Panamanian 
control.

(Feulner is president of The Heritage Foundation, a 
Washington-based research organization.)

Mr. and Mrs. Ollie Sud- 
duth and son. Tod, grand­
son and family of Mrs. 
Hubert Baker moved here 
February 1, to assist Mrs. 
Baker in running a business 
enterprise.

Phone
Stockman.
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THE LION’S 
ROAR
Gigi McKinney 
Jeannine Perry 
Robert Longoria
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AUSTIN—Only a little 
more than 60 per cent of the 
state’s eight million eligible 
voters are registered, and 
Texas Secretary of State 
Steve Oaks has kicked off a 
massive drive to raise the 
figure.

The registration effort 
aims at signing up at least 
another one million voters.

A bilingual staff will co­
ordinate the effort from 
Oak’s office, working with 
newspapers, radio and tele­
vision stations and civic 
groups.

For the first time, voters 
can register by mail with a 
postage-free post card appli­
cation form submitted to 
tounty tax ’̂a1;ses*s%-coIlec­
tors.
. When an application 
processed, a new yellow reg­
istration certificate will be 
mailed to the voter. Current 
blue cards expire March I.

Voters now registered au­
tomatically receive 1978-79 
certificates, but many arc 
being returned due to 
changes of address and a 
“cleanup” of voter rolls. In 
Dallas, 28 per cent of the 
600,000 certificates have 
been returned to local elec­
tion officials. Oaks said.

Voters who haven’t re­
ceived their yellow certifi­
cates already, should make 
applications now. Oaks ad­
vised. Registration is possible 
up to 30 days before an elec­
tion.

More than 2,000 grocery 
and convenience stores and 
about 500 high schools, col­
leges and universities will re­
ceive application forms dis­
tributed by Oaks’ office.

Eleven thousand letters 
will be sent to citizens or­
ganizations requesting their 
help.

Benefits Cut
The joint federal-state ex­

tended unemployment bene­
fits program in Texas has 
ended due to a drop in the 
national insured unemploy­
ment rate.

Texas Employment Com­
mission was notified of the 
discontinuance in line with 
automatic “triggering” for­
mulas.

Extended benefits were 
paid to claimants who ex­
hausted regular state bene­
fits and were still unable to 
find work. They are financed 
50-50 from state and federal 
money.

Regular benefits will con­
tinue as usual.

Extended benefits for De­
cember totalled about $2.3 
million .statewide.

A national “trigger” of 4.5 
per cent insured unemploy­
ment will activate or discon­
tinue automatically the pay­
ment of extended benefits. 
The insured unemployment 
rate in Texas never ap­
proached that figure. It was 
1.4 per cent at the time of 
the extended benefit cut, 4.7 
per cent overall. All states 
must begin or end the pay­
ment when the national rate 
reaches 4.5 per cent, rising 
or falling.

Half-Crop Asked
Farmers in South Texas 

this week are being ap­

proached in a big organiza­
tional drive to sign agree­
ments to slash their planted 
acreage in half.

American Agriculture 
(farm strike) leaders said 
farmers from 40 other states 
will be working in 40 coun­
ties of South Texas in an 
effort to get the commit­
ments.

.Strikers met in Dallas to 
formulate wording of the “50 
per cent no plant” policy 
statement. In effect, farmers 
are being asked to reduce 
their planted acreage by 50 
per cent in the 1978 crop 
year.

“We have to figure how 
far to go in dealing with 
thosif (vhcf^dfhi’t want to par­
ticipate,” .said a spokesman 
fc)f th^^Tiovement for higher 
farm prices. “We cannot 
have any violence.”

Courts Speak
The Court of Criminal 

Appeals upheld constitution­
ality of the law changing the 
method of capital punish­
ment from the electric chair 
to injection by lethal sub­
stance.

An Austin federal district 
court held the Texas child 
pornography control law un­
constitutional because it 
doesn’t provide that films 
and photographs to be ban­
ned must be “obscene.”

A drug manufacturer won 
a retrial, through Supreme 
Court verdict, of a case in 
which a Corpus Christi man 
who lost his hearing after 
taking one of the company’s 
infection control drugs was 
awarded a $400,000 damage 
verdict.

The Supreme Court up­
held a jury verdict against 
the suit by a man who said 
he traded a Dallas hotel for 
Burnet County lake lots but 
discovered the person he was 
dealing with didn’t own the 
lots.

A life sentence assessed a 
Wichita Falls police officer 
accused of hiring a gunman 
to kill his estranged wife was 
upheld by the Court of Crim­
inal Appeals.

The .Supreme Court con­
cluded a company’s term 
royalties were not ended by 
a 103-day drilling halt in 
Live Oak County.

The Third Court of Civil 
Appeals agreed an architect 
accused of placing his name 
and seal on plans for a hos­
pital in Brownsville drawn 
by another architect should 
lose his license.

Short Snorts
J. Chrys Dougherty of 

Austin and John Estes of 
Dallas have been nominated 
for president-elect by the 
State Bar of Texas board of 
directors. Election for the 
State Bar presidency will be 
by written ballot among 30,- 
000 lawyers in April.

A city which elected to 
exempt itself from terms of 
a law creating a firefighters 
relief and retirement fund 
for volunteer firemen is not 
required to create a retire­
ment system of its own for 
the volunteer firefighters, 
Atty. Gen. John Hill said.

Thursday, Feb. 10, 1949
Coach J.A. Pelto’s basket­

ball squad earned a tie for 
the west half district champ­
ionship.

29 yrs. ago
Mr. W.W. Ruscoe will 

conduct the OHS Band in a 
clinic at Brady March 5, 
along with 20 other school.

29 yrs. ago
The Crockett County 4-H 

Club members exhibited five 
fat steers and 25 lambs at the 
Houston Fat Stock Show last 
week and took off $90 in 
prizes. Earl Berry, Bill 
Schneemann, Jimmy Mc- 
Mullan, Graham Childress, 
Ben Conklin, and others 
were listed.

29 yrs. ago
Measles are still going the 

rounds among Ozonans and 
schools have shown effects of 
the epidemic with high ab­
sences.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Butane Co. has 

reduced their butane gas to 
12 and 13 cents per gallon.

29 yrs. ago
Open house throughout 

the public school system here 
on Monday, March 7, will 
initiate the round of Spring 
activities in the local system.

29 yrs. ago
Boy Scout Week was ob­

served ths week with one 
Ozona troop having attrac­
tive Window displays in two 
downtown stores. Boys in 
this troop included T. Finer, 
Allen Haire Sellers Laxson, 
Wilburn Conklin, D. Capps, 
B. Maness, B. Gillit, B. West 
and N. Hill.

29 yrs. ago
Estimated $30,000 needed 

for equipment and furnish­
ings for the Hospital in 
Ozona. The new hospital is 
nearing completion.

29 yrs. ago
Ozona Music Club met 

Thursday in the home of 
Mrs. Stephen Perner with 
Mrs. Charles Applewhite, 
Mrs. Cleophas Cooke, Mrs. 
George Schulz and Mrs. Fred 
Parker as assisting hostess-

29 yrs. ago
Student of the Week at 

OHS is a six foot briinette, 
brown eyes and is #7. He is 
Armond Hoover, a senior.

29 yrs. ago
The WSCS were enter­

tained at tea in the home of 
Mrs. B.B, Ingham Wed.

¥ 3 S
SNIPS, QUIPS, 

AND LIFTS 
By Lottie Lee Baker

Criticizing an egg is eas­
ier than laying one.

****
There is just no digni­

fied way to slip on an icy 
sidewalk-so watch your step.

4c9):4:9ic
A lot of modern novels 

have one thing in common- 
their covers are too far apart.

♦***
There’s little danger of our 

government being over­
thrown. There’s too much of 
it.

****
America has more TVs 

than bathtubs. Guess com­
mercials aren’t long enough 
to permit taking a bath.

****
Once again the calendar 

shows two W ashington’s 
birthdays. He must be our 
first born-again president.

4c Hi 4c 4:
Seen the new pink income 

tax forms? Finally, IRS has 
learned to blush.

4c 4c 4c 4c

Somehow it’s hard to con­
nect thrift with Washington’s 
Birthday sales. Isn’t he the 
fellow that threw a dollar 
away.

4c 4c 4c 4c

Stretch your imagination 
too far and it will snap back 
at you as trouble.

4c 4c 4c 4c

Some people we know 
would make great rooming- 
house operators-they just 
love to take in rumors.

4c 4c 4c 4c

Since we were given two 
ears and one mouth we 
should know right off that we 
should listen twice as much 
as we talk.

4c 4c 4c 4c

More good intentions die 
young, but not because they 
were executed.

4c 4c 4c 4c

Living on a budget is like 
living beyond your means, 
except you have a record of 
it.

4c4c4c4c

BASKETBALL NEWS
Last Friday, the JV girls 

beat Crane for another win. 
Congratulations!

Tuesday, the Lionettes 
played Lakeview there and 
the Lions played Menard 
here.

Friday the A and B girls 
will travel to Iraan to beat 
the Braves starting at 6:30 
and the A and B boys will 
travel to Kermit to play the 
Yellowjackets beginning at 
6:15. We need your support, 
so back the Lions and Lion­
ettes. Good Luck!

The Junior High played 
their last games Monday. 
Congratulations Cubs on 
your great season!

LR
ONE-ACT PLAY CHOSEN

Last Thursday, tryouts 
were held for the UIL One- 
Act Play. Twenty-two people 
tried for the seven parts and 
even Coach Porter admitted 
that the competition was 
tough. Portraying characters 
in the play will be Danny 
Weant, Gigi McKinney, Rob­
ert Longoria, Jeannine Per­
ry, Max Schroeder, Teresa 
Brown, and Blake Moody. 
Stage crew members are 
Lucy Perner, Gregg Perry, 
and Steve Pagan. Congrats 
to all of you and Work Hard!

LR
SENIOR RINGS ORDERED

Those Juniors finally got a 
taste of “ Senior-itis” when 
they ordered senior rings 
Wednesday. How does it feel 
to be moving on up, Jrs.?

LR
SONORA SPEECH MEET

Friday, several students 
will attend the Sonora speech 
meet. The preliminary 
rounds will be held on Fri­
day and final rounds on Sat­
urday. Good Luck to all of 
you!

LR
ACT TEST

The ACT Test will be given 
Saturday morning at 8 
o’clock in the high school 
library. If you have to take it, 
don’t be late--it’s a very 
important date!

LR
BIRTHDAYS

Happy Birthday to Bill 
Dbfflley, Connie Perez, and 
Joel Sanchez.

LR
POEM WINNERS

Our judges couldn’t de­
cide which of these Valen­
tine poems was best, so we 
decided to publish both. 
Congratulations to our win­
ners because it was a tough 
decision.

LR
VALENTINE’S DAY

There is a day for lov­
ers only,

A day for happiness when 
you are lonely.

A day for love and a 
moment of caring,

A day for joy, a lifetime of 
sharing.

It is a day for me and also 
for you.

When all of your dreams 
and wishes come true.

A day when laughter fills 
your heart.

A day when you two just 
could not part.

A day when cupid shot his 
bow;

And his little arrow touch­
ed your soul.

A day for cards and nice 
little things.

A box of candy and tiny 
heart rings.

There are also colors of 
white, pink, and red,

And that beautiful person 
fills your head.

Though you can’t really 
describe the way you feel

But you know this feeling 
it’s got to be real.

There is only one time you 
feel this way.

God Bless you, I love you 
on Valentine’s Day.

by Tffly Kramer 
LR

TO LOVE OR NOT 
TO LOVE

To love or not to love, that 
is the question, whether it is 
nobler in the mind to feel the 
slings and arrows of a de­
feated love. To love again 
and to feel the sunshine and 
the birds sing, if it be the 
way I want, let it be the way 
it was before this defeated 
love came to be. For it was 
not that I didn’t care, it was 
that she didn’t care, so it is 
better to have loved and lost, 
than not to have loved at all!

by Hector Goiterrez

LR
PUBLIC NOTICE:

Heavens to Hearts!! Val­
entine’s Day is only 6 days 
away! Get you a sweet­
heart now! Contact any 
LBTC member-Call BR-549 
and don’t wait or it might be 
too late!

LR
STEAMING BOWL 
OF THE WEEK

OHS is plagued with a new 
rare disease. Already Con­
nie G., Sylvia E., Letic­
ia T., Veronica T., Kathy S., 
Anna D.M., Mary T., Liz­
zie F., and Karen W. have 
caught this disease. Watch 
out! They may be conta­
gious! The most common 
symptoms are forgetfulness 
of dates and numbers and 
their j sickness seems to in­
crease in bookkeeping each 
day when they total columns 
and date papers. Strange- 
very strange! Hopefully 
there will be no epidemic but 
we fear it has already spread 
to all parts of the school. All 
that is known now is that in 
its last stage it is common­
ly known as “ Spring Fever.’’ 

LR
Louis B., kicked the habit 

and became rich last week, 
even though the old saying 
says, “VIOLENCE NEVER 
PAYS’’. It seems Louis has a 
way to turn candy machines 
into slot machines. Right, 
Louis?

LR
NEW NAMES OF 
THE WEEK

“Ditch” to Robert Tam- 
bunga

“ Spit” to Jeannine Perry.

Losing Week For 
OHS Basketballers
By-Gregg Perry

It was a disappointing 
week for the O.H.S. Basket­
ball teams with the Girls 
Junior Varsity having the 
only win of the week.

The boys varsity almost 
did it. They nearly missed 
doing what many people who 
have watched District 7-AA 
basketball said is impossible. 
They came up just two points 
short of beating the Crane 
Golden Cranes. Crane, heav­
ily favored to win the dis­
trict, just couldn’t believe 
their eyes as the Lions came 
out giving all they had and 
jumping out to a 12 point 
lead in the first half. But 
victory was to be short lived 
for the Lions as Crane’s 
James Fort came out for 24 
points in the second half and 
made a close ballgame of it. 
As in last week’s game, free 
throws were the key as the 
Crane team won on a couple 
of fi-ee throws within the last 
30 seconds, 49-51.

High point was Douglas 
Bean with 14, Danny Weant 
was second with 10.

The JV also dropped their 
game to Crane 49-60. High 
point was Alfred Enriquez 
with 14 points. Aldo Delgado 
was second with 11.

The girl’s varsity didn’t 
have one of their better

weeks either. The first loss 
was a true cliff-hanger to 
Snyder, 60-62. Kathy San­
chez scored 25 of the points 
and Ruth DeLaRosa, 20.

The girls played Crane and 
the varsity lost 43-69. One 
outstanding feature was 
Ruth DeLaRosa being high 
point with 19 points, all on 
free throws. She was 19 for 
21 on the night. Lori Clay­
ton and Kathy Sanchez were 
behind her with 10 each.

The JV went 1-1 on the 
week, falling to Snyder first 
26-48. Tilly Kramer was high 
point with 12, while Molly 
Womack and Kaye Thomp­
son followed with 4.

The JV girls then took the 
first and only win over Crane 
29-22. High point in the 
game was Kaye Thompson 
with 10, followed by Molly 
Womack with 9.

Tuesday the boys hosted 
Menard while the girls trav­
eled to Lakeview. Friday the 
boys will make the trip to 
Kermit for another district 
game and the girls will be in 
Iraan.

PHONE NEWS TO THE 
STOCKMAN

Ozona
Business 

And 
Professional 

Guide
‘‘THE FRAME SHOP’ 

Larry Hensley 
803 Ave G 
392-2142

After 5:30 Week-day 
9-6 On Week-ends.

CANNONAIR 

60610th St. 

Phone 392-2164

CAROL’S CERAMICS 
901 Ave. J 
392-3482

Greenware-Duncan 
Paints Supplies 
Will fire it for you.

MAXINE’S 
FLOWER SHOP

Fresh Cut-Pot Plants 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

THE CAMERAS TWO

Sandra Chlldress-Chris Hill 
^92-3103 392-3106

‘Call For Appointment
Contemporary Photography

WINDMILL & PUMP 
SERVICE

A1 Thomerson 
Box 116 

Ph. 392-2577

VFW POST 6109
Regular Meetings 

Third Tuesday 
In Each Month 

8 P.M.

THE CATERERS 
Friday evening 

& weekends 
CaU

392-2335
392-3129

OZONA BUTANE CO.
Plumbing & Repair 

G.E. Appliance 
1108 Ave. E 392-3013

THE LINE
Your Party Merchant 

15 Mi. E.offI-10 
Beer,Uqnor,Wine 

Ph. 387-2956

THE
BAGGETT AGENCY

Insurance 
“Your Protection 

Is Our Profession” 
1114 Ave. E 392-2606

BROWN FURNITURE 
COMPANY

Beautiful Interiors 
Designed with 

DRAPERY-CARPET 
Fine Furniture •
& Accessories___

OZONA CHAPTER 287
Order of the Eastern Star 

Meeting Night 
4th Tuesday in Mo. 

Masonic Hall

NORMA’S
KOUNTRY KITCHEN

Take Out Orders 
Chicken-Pizza-Fish 

Off I-IO West 
Phone 392-3508

‘THE GIFT HORSE” 
Owner-Judy Prohst

1102 Avenue E
Gallery and 

Hand- Crafted Gifts

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday Bible Study-9:45 
Morning Service-10:45 
Evening Service-6:00 
Wednesday-7:30 p.m.

CUFF WILLIAMSON

Mechanic

1208 Ave. F 
Ph. 392-2659

J.W. MOTOR PARTS

Auto Parts & Supplies 
606 n th  St. 

392-2343

B&C AUTOMOTIVE

Complete Auto Repair 
&  Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 

Cor. of 11th & Ave. C
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Our ji»b Is Pleasing ISm With... Advertised Specials'Friendly Service'Wide Selection Of Pr^ucte
JiN i S ~

FOODWAYThe HcMne of V diie Prices
PRICES 800D THURS., PER. 9th THRU S A T ., PER. 11th umit RIGHTS

RESERVED

USD! CHOICE "PS”  
ROHELESS

RUMP ROAST

PERSONALLY
SELECTED

USD! CHOICE S”

T-RONE
STEAK

$
LB

BONELESS USDA CHOICE
LOIN TIP STEAK Lb. $1.89
LEAN & TENDER h l  a q  
CUBE STEAK

Good Value

Bacon 12-OZ
PKG *1

09

5-LB
BAG

GOOD VALUE

PURE CANE 
SU6AR

89
LIMIT 1 PLEASE

GOOD VALUE-ASSORTED

LUNCH 
MEATS

7 9 ^
BONELESS LEAN | L  &i a a  
STEW MEAT

PERSONALLY
SELECTED

HEAT HANAfiER’S SALE!
Round Steak

/ "  USUA CHOICE 
PERSONALLT SELECTEU

SIRLOIN 
STEAK

BONELESS LOIN,  I e o  0 0  
STRIP STEAK L D .  J O . Z Y

TURBOT
FILLETS

-------------Turkey Franks
Lb. $1.69 s l ic e d  b a c o n

PLANTATION BEAUTY 
SKINLESS

Plantation
Beauty

FROM THE 
BEEF ROUND

12-OZ
PKG

8-OZ
PKG 69

SNOWDRIFT

SHORTENING

CHECK THESE VALUES!

Shasta
12-OZ.
Cans

"HUNTS” TOMATO SAUCE

8  OZ.

CANS

CRISCO
OIL

4i OZ. ROT.

COLD POWER 
DETERGENT

GIANT O  
SIZE BOX O

U.S. NO. 2 
RUSSET

w i i n

TELLOW 
ONIONS

Potatoes

V
LB l O * 10-Lb.

BAG

WASHINGTON EXTRA FANCT

DELICIOUS
APPLES

3 ? 1

SUNKIST c.iif 
NAVEL a

0

■ I*
■ 3 » 1

CELERY 3»̂ > $1 Tomatoes SLbs.SI

C heck O u t  T h e  $ ^ u e s
"rET ”  EVAPORATED

MILK

3 ^

"VAN CAMPS”

BEANS

^ 02- f t O r^ 0  CAN

"MELLOW”

ROAST
COFFEE

IIIIMTt

TOMATO CATSUP

WE WELCOME 
FOOD STAMP CUSTOMERS

n r i r i  i \ r  m  i a

GREEN BEANS
16 OZ.

CAN

T T| J JRAINBOW

TOMATOES

16 O Z. 
CANS

DAIRY FO O D S ...S A V E !

SSk Orange Juice Chilled 6 4 - 0 Z $ 1 4 3  
8TL I

SINGLE SLICES

AHERICAN
f 3  CHEESE * 1PKG ■

05

Biscuits Buttermilk,
Sweetmilk 3 8-OZ Q Q (

TUBES V W

EEI Cinnamon Rolls

0 1 6  11™STREET O Z O N A .T E X .
. . .  HOME OWNED 4  OPERATED

«S>rORE HOURS 
7'30AM -600PM  MON-SAT 

C L O SE D  SU ND AY  -
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Tips
For Gardeners

■ From the 
Ozona Gavdcn Clab 

*>y
Mrs. Bafl^Poat

THE OZONA STOCKMAN

February may be a great 
time because we get those 
first breaths of spring that 
mean gardening is really 
about to start. Quince, pussy 
willow, January jasm ine, 
winter honeysuckle bloom 
and crocus, snowdrops and 
early narcissus abound. You 
can pick and choose the jobs 

^that mean the most to you in 
preparation for gardening 
activity.

Now is a good time to 
divide ferns. It’s also time to 
start new hanging baskets of 
Swedish and other ivies, the 
wondering jew, piggy back, 
trailing coleus and other 
drooping plants that you
want to be heavy and full 
when you place them out­
doors after frost.

Try a new idea this year- 
plant a mint hanging basket. 
Take some plain mint or 
preferably curly mint (it 
droops better), from the 
garden and start it in a moss- 
lined basket. Not only will 
the top grow into a fine mint 
patch, but the underground 
stems will grow through the 
moss on the bottom and sides 
and produce an interesting, 
as well as practical, basket. 
Apple mint makes a beauti­
ful plant.

Complete bare-root plant­
ing and transplanting this 
month. Continue planting 
balled-and-burlapped and 
container grown plants 
throughout the spring. Fer­
tilize plants, including woody 
ground covers, as soon as 
new growth becomes appar­
ent.

IVRss Saner 
Weds Mr. 
Schneemann

Miss Brenda Saner of Fort 
Worth became the bride of 
Max Schneemann, III in a 
ceremony performed Febru­
ary 7, at the St. Andrews 
Catholic Church in Fort 
Worth.

The bride is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Saner and the bridegroom is 
the son of Mrs. Max Schnee­
mann Jr. and grandson of 
Mr. and Mrs. Max Schnee­
mann of Ozona.

Miss Fierro 
To Fashion 
College

Elizabeth Fierro, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Encarnation 
V. Fierro of Ozona has been 
accepted by Bauder Fashion 
College in Arlington for the 
Fashion Merchandising and 
Modeling program begin­
ning September, 1978.

Miss Fierro will be study­
ing Fashion Merchandising 
and Modeling and plans a 
career in that field.

During her year at Bau­
der Fashion College, Miss 
Fierro will be active in civic 
and college activities such as 
field trips to museums, man­
ufacturers, display or adver­
tising departments in retail 
stores, fashion and trade 
shows, modeling trainee as­
signments, seasonal proms 
and monthly social activities.

ELIZABETH FIERRO 
....p lans Fashion Career

Artist To 
Be Here For 
Denumstration

Steve Benton, Georgetown 
artist, will be in Ozona 
February 18-19 for a demon­
stration and showings He will 
give a demons^etion in oils 
at Art, Etc. Sat. I^eb. 18, and 
will show his work at the Gift 
Horse Sun. Feb  ̂ 19. Both 
days the events will be held 
between 2 and 4 p.m.

Benton is a graduate of 
Southw estern U niversity. 
His main subject matters are 
old bams and buildings, 
anything with character, he 
says, He woria primarily in 
oil, but also does water- 
color, pen and ink, and pen­
cil.

He owns and operates his 
own gallery and frame shop 
in Georgetown. He has also 
held several workshops and 
classes in instructing in oil 
painting and drawing.

H opeIPW ps 
Pledges At 
Southwestern

Hope Phillips of Ozona has 
been named as a pledge of 
Zeta Tau Alpha Sorority at 
Southwestern University at 
Georgetown.

The announcement came 
following rush festivities last 
week at the state's oldest 
university.

Hope, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Hillery Phillips Jr. of 
Ozona, is a freshman at 
Southwestern.

She is a graduate of Ozona 
High School where she serv­
ed as .editor of the year­
book, was nam ed Band 
Sweetheart, and graduated 
with cum laude honors.

COUNTRY CLUB BRIDGE
Mrs. Joe Friend was hos­

tess for luncheon and bridge 
at the Country Club Thurs­
day.

Winning high was Mrs. 
Jack Williams, while second 
high went to Mrs. Clay 
Adams, and low to Mrs. John 
Childress. Mrs. Hillery Phil­
lips won the bingo.

Others attending were 
Mrs. Gene Williams, Mrs. 
Joe Bean, Mrs. Lowell Lit­
tleton, Mrs. John R. Hun- 
nicutt, Mrs. Eddie Arnold, 
Mrs. Bruce Mayfield, Mrs. 
Sid Milspaugh, Mrs. Kirby 
Moore, Mrs. Sherman Tay­
lor, Mrs. Lefty Walker, Mrs. 
George Bunger, Mrs. 
Charles Black, Mrs. Beecher 
Montgomery, Mrs. Cuatro 
Davidson, Mrs. Bud Cox, 
Mrs. Byron Williams, Mrs. 
Jim Bob Bailey, Mrs. Bob 
Bailey and Mrs. Arthur Kyle.

Luncheon guests were 
Mrs. Kenny McMullan, Mrs. 
Zona Hallcomb, Mrs. Robert 
Cox and Mrs. Tommy Harris.

Phone News To The 
Stockman.

On M onday, February 13, 
1978,our office telephone

number w ill be changed 

to

392-2627
Law Offices of G. Dixon Mahon, Incorporated.

DOUBLE FEATURE WEEKEND
MRS. SCHNEEMANN

Maid of honor was Miss 
Beverly Ferrill of Stephen- 
ville, and the bridesmaids 
were Miss Shryl Schnee­
mann, Miss Jill Schneemann 
of Big Lake, Miss Leslie 
McCreary of Stephenville, 
and Miss Mary Lee Ellis of 
Fort Worth.

Serving as best man was 
Steve Schneemann of Fort 
Stockton. Groomsmen were 
Mark Tillman of Ozona, Gary 
Saner of Ft. Worth, Tommy 
Holt and Larry Settle of Big 
Lake. Ushers were Steve 
Beauregard and Bobby 
Zesch of San Angelo, Jack 
Alexander of Polleville, Mark 
Mills, Brownwood; Phillip 
Harrison of Eastland and 
Ralph Harrison of Cisco.

Following the ceremony, a 
reception at the Colonial 
Country Club was held in Ft. 
Worth.

After a wedding trip to 
New Orleans, the couple will 
be at home on the ranch at 
Big Lake.

W e ’re  a l l  
deck ed  out  
w i t h  S t e v e  
Benton
originals and 
invite, you to 
visit us be­
tween 2 and 4 
p.m. Sunday, 
Feb. 19, to 
m e e t  Steve  
and see his 
worl
the Gift Horse

1102 Ave. E

Art Etc.
1104 11th St.

A demonstra­
tion in oils byi 
Steve Benton, 
Georgetown 
artist, will bej 
held in our. 
s tud io  Sat.,I 
Feb. 18, fromi 
2 to 4 p.m. It is 
availab le  to_ 
\anyone inter-i 
ested. Register 
by Wed. Feb. 
16, by calling 
Art Etc. 
392-3459 or 
the Gift Horse 
392-2481.

12 years of age, and two to 
three for children nine years 
and under. Other food sour­
ces rich in calcium are dried 
fruits, leafy green vegeta­
bles, molasses and dried 
beans.

Some people need extra 
calcium. Women on weight 
reduction diets lose calcium— 
so they require an addition­
al supply of calcium. In some 
older people, the small intes­
tine does not absorb calci­
um well. Increased calcium 
intake is needed to over­
come this problem. In addi­
tion, hormone systems affect 
calcium balance. The hormo­
nal balance change brought 
on by menopause causes a 
major loss of bone calcium. 
Emotions also affect calcium 
retension adversely, as does 
inactivity.

In a small saucepan sprin­
kle 1 envelope unflavored 
gelatin over Vi cup milk. Stir 
over low heat until dissolv­
ed. Place in blender con­
tainer with fruit and 1 cup 
light corn syrup. Cover; 
blend on high speed 30 sec­
onds. Pour into metal bak­
ing pan. Cover; freeze over­

night. Soften slightly at room 
tem perature. Spoon into 
large bowl. With mixer at 
low speed, beat until smooth 
but not melted. Quickly pour 
into mold or freezer con­
tainer. Cover, freeze. Makes 
3 Vi to 4 cups.

Use 3 cups cantaloupe, 
honeydew, watermelon, pea­
ches*, pineapple, papaya*, 
nectarines*, or whole blue­
berries, or whole strawber­
ries.

* Toss fruit with 1 
blespoon lemon juice.

ta-
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r a S H U G A R T  C O U P O N  US 
SAT. 18

WHITES AUTO
910 11TH ST.

9
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS

. - - v  9 9 4A "  a s k
About Our

J  S F IB B IS  I  E xtra c h a r g e  
V 8  X 1 0 /  fo r  

G R O U P S

DUPLICATE 
BRIDGE WINNERS

Winners in Duplicate 
Bridge play Saturday after­
noon at the Country Club 
were Mrs. Sidney Mills- 
paugh and Frank Tillman, 
first, and Mrs. Frank Tillman 
and Mrs. Sherman Taylor, 
second.

Purchase your Ideal Book­
keeping System at The Ozo­
na Stockman.

NOW OPEN 
Sport Shack, Southwest Tex.

VILLAGE SHOPPING CENTER

Catalogue Store 
Sporting Goods from A to Z 
Garland and Joyce Young

Make dietary calcium a 
part of normal everyday 
meals-and avoid destructive 
calcium loss. Too little cal­
cium for a long period of time 
may lead to osteoporosis 
(porous bones)—which can 
result in bone fractures and 
backbone deformities in old­
er persons.

All persons, including bab­
ies, need calcium for bones 
and other body tissue—whet­
her from milk or other sour­
ces. Recommended Dietary 
Allowances calcium needed 
each day for different age 
groups are: 360 to 540 mil­
ligrams for infants, 800 mil­
ligrams for children, 1,200 
milligrams for teens, 800 mil­
ligrams for adults, and 1,200 
milligrams for pregnant and 
lactating women.

Milk-or calcium equivi- 
lent amounts of milk pro- 
ducts-recommended daily 
for adults is a minimum of 
two cups, three or more cups 
for pregnant women, four or 
more for nursing mothers, 
four or more for teens, three 
or more for children nine to

»  s

VILLAGE SHOPPING CENTER-OZONA

Monday
Mark
12:18-27 ^

Tuesday
Mark
12:28-34

Wednesday
Mark
13:1-23

Thursday
Mark
13:24-37

Friday
Mark
14:1-25

Saturday
Mark
14:32-50

To many people a lifetime is a number of days, weeks, 
months and years. It is the time measured from the day of 
our birth to the day of our death.

Isn't a lifetime more than chronological years? Isn't a 
lifetime really a succession of meaningful events that occur 
in the life of each one of us?

Regardless of the past, our age, or in whatever state we 
find ourself today, at church we can find that we still have 
A LIFETIME TO LIVE.

Scriptures selected by The American Bible Society Copyright 1978 Keister Advertising Service, Strasburg, Virginia

THIS SERIES OF ADS IS BEING PUBLISHED AND SPONSORED BY THE OZONA 
BUSINESS FRMS IN THE INTEREST OF A STRONGER COMMUNITY.

Ranch Feed & Supply Co. 
Brown Furniture Co. 

Ozona Butane Co. 
Hi-W ay Cafe 
Ozona Stockman 
Ozona Oil Company

So. Tex. Lmbr. Co.

W hite’s Auto 
Food w ay Stores 
S tuart M otor Co.

L-B M otor Co., Inc. 
Ozona TV  System 
Ozona National Bank
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Crockett County 
Care Center News

by Joan Nicholas

Activities Program Director

Arabs Spending New Found 
Oil Wealth On Sheep

On Tuesday evening the 
winner of the monthly Bin- 
go contest was presented 
with a gift certificate to the 
Teacher Store, donated by 
Lefty’s Turkey Patch--the 
lucky winner? Mary Seelye, 
with 250 points.

On Wednesday, Elizabeth 
Dudley played the piano for a 
morning of good old fash­
ioned hymn singing. Paul 
Cavin was in fine fettle and 
Hank Poeller and several of 
our ladies joined in as I 
zoomed around helping find 
places in the hymn books, 
(excellent exercise!) After 
lunch when everyone was 
retiring to rooms for rest, 
cupid crept around and dec­
orated the doors with the 
hearts made in crafts the 
past four weeks. They boast 
every design imaginable and 
no two are alike. Maybe we 
started the Valentine season 
a little early, but decided we 
might as well enjoy it for 
more than one day.

Thursday morning we wel­
comed another beauty oper­
ator to the volunteer crew- 
Mrs. C.E. Light.

It’s too bad that this cold, 
damp weather has brought 
prolonged pain and arthritic 
discomfort to so many, but 
perhaps the sun will shine 
again soon and we can get 
back to normal.

Beulah Baggett recovered 
sufficiently from her acciden­
tal injury to go home last 
week. Dollye Coates is back 
with us after a spell in the 
hospital, and Albert Bailey, 
we are sorry to say, is now in 
the hospital having been 
taken ill on Friday.

On Thursday afternoon I 
read ten suggestions from 
Guide Posts on how to chase 
away the blues. Then we 
discussed the possibility of 
life from outer space and 
UFO sightings over the 
U.S.A. Several opinions were

limitsf On
Telephone
Solicitations

Consumers wanting limits 
on telephone solicitations, 
take heart-support may be 
on the way, says Claudia 
Kerbel, consumer informa­
tion specialist with the Tex­
as Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M 
University System.

Recommendations to help 
protect personal privacy are 
now under study-with auto­
mated dialing devices get­
ting special attention, Ms. 
Kerbel says.

Each device is capable of 
calling more than 1,000 tele­
phone numbers per day—on 
either a random or pre­
selected basis.

Some machines play a 
recorded message up to six 
minutes in length.

‘ ‘ Business organizations 
using these machines reach 
thousands of consumers-di- 
rectly and inexpensively,” 
the specialist continues.

Recommendations to limit 
telephone solicitations were 
submitted by the Office of 
Consumer Affairs (OCA) and 
they are now under study by 
the Federal Communications 
Commission.

Specifically, OCA recom­
mended that FCC study the 
feasibility of adopting seven 
measures relating to auto­
mated dialing devices and 
other telephone soliciters.

These measures would:
Require that telephone 

subscribers have an oppor- 
tunity-at least annually-to 
place their names on lists of 
persons who would be pro­
tected from solicitation, re­
quire that firms which em­
ploy this form of advertis­
ing bear the costs for com­
piling and maintaining these 
lists. Also Establish penal­
ties for violators-with fines 
for repeated violators, re­
quire solicitations that use  ̂
automated dialing devices 
and recorded messages to 
begin with the statement, 
“This is a recorded mes­
sage.

Limit taped messages to 
one minute in areas where 
placing the telephone receiv­
er on the cradle does not 
disconnect an incoming call, 
establish limits on the hours 
during which telephone soli­
citations would be permitt­
ed, determine the effect that 
telephone solicitations have 
on the telephone system—so 
that fees paid by soliciters 
reflect actual cost.

expressed, pro and con. An 
article from a Reader’s Di­
gest was used as source 
material for the study.

The mystery can made its 
appearance once more and 
the question “what do you 
remember about your first 
car” brought on much nos­
talgia for the good old days of 
running boards and cranking 
up! Mike Pena displayed a 
scar where a “ Model-A” 
kicked back at him and broke 
his wrist. Swede Lundgren, 
obviously in his element with 
a favorite subject, recalled a 
fond memory of his first 
vehicle, the name of which 
eluded him, but was of 1911 
or 1912 vintage. He stated 
proudly “ I got 30 miles per 
hour flat out” .

In answer to “what do you 
like best about the Care 
Center” Paul Cavin said 
“ the association with the 
people” , Leona Harris came 
up with “being cared for, the 
food, and not having to wash 
dishes!” That little senti­
ment was echoed by all the 
ladies present. Evelyn Bry­
ant said “ the director of 
nurses, Mrs. Farris, because 
she is kind and treats ev­
eryone alike and has pat­
ience” . Frances Tolson and 
Mike Pena both stated em­
phatically, “ Everything!”

Michelle Couch, a seventh 
grader, sat with us during 
study and discussion and was 
introduced to everyone. She 
will visit one afternoon a 
week after school and give 
our ladies manicures. We 
appreciate this so much.

Gordon Smith had a pretty 
full day, Thursday, on his 
birthday. He and Nita De- 
Priest went out for both 
lunch and dinner, first with 
his daughter and family, and 
then his son and family from 
Sonora.

It was good to see Sue 
Arledge back helping at Bin- 
go Friday morning, having 
finally overcome the ‘flu bug.

A delicious cake was 
brought in by C.Lee Cona­
way. Thanks so much.

Hank Poeller was able to 
leave his wheelchair behind 
and walked to the living area 
Monday morning; he looked 
as if he was doing very well.

Can’t wait ’til Wednesday 
morning; our musical per­
cussion instruments have ar­
rived and we will be able to 
experiment, and who knows, 
“ Crockett County Care Cent­
er Pops” might become a 
reality!

Ever since the Arabs 
learned to change oil into 
gold, they’ve been spending 
that new-found wealth all 
over the world in conspic­
uous ways. Now they’re 
spending it on sheep-in one 
manner or another.

Strange as it may seem for 
descendants of some of the 
world’s first sheepherders to 
be ranging across the globe 
in search of woolies, it’s 
altogether true. New Zealand 
and Australian sheepmen are 
filling most of the orders, but 
it’s not because the Ameri­
can industry hasn’t been 
asked. We just don’t have 
the stock to spare.

Our domestic sheep indus-

Shop For
Savings
Accounts

In choosing a savings ac­
count, obtaining the maxi­
mum legal rate of interest 
affects the “where” and 
“ how” of setting one up, 
says Mrs. Linda McCormack, 
family resource management 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice.

For the most profitable 
program, set up a savings 
account based on five major 
factors, the specialist sug­
gests.

Stated rate of interest- 
look for institutions paying 
the highest rates, formulas 
for computing interest-there 
are over 50 bookkeeping 
methods used to compute 
interest on savings accounts. 
“ Day-of-deposit to day-of- 
withdrawal” is the most ad­
vantageous method to the 
depositor.

Day of month a savings 
account starts to earn inter­
est-some accounts calculate 
deposits received by the 10th 
day to earn from the first of 
the month.

Frequency of compound­
ing interest-a process for 
calculating interest on inter­
est-more frequently.;, com­
pounded interest derives 
greater profit.

Remember, money earned 
from compounded interest 
actually goes into the account 
only at certain times-when 
the account is “ credited” 
with its compounded inter­
est.

Frequency of crediting- 
the process of actually put­
ting the interest calculated 
into an account. Consider 
frequency of account credit­
ing-such as the first of the 
month, or quarterly, or every 
six months or each year.

try has benefitted from the 
increased Arab demand, 
however, at least in the 
opinion of New Zealand and 
Australian spokesmen.

Representatives from the 
“ down-under” countries re­
cently told U.S. sheepmen 
that the Arab buying has 
taken some import pressure 
off of our lamb industry. The 
occasion was the joint con­
vention of the National Wool 
Growers and the National 
Lamb Feeders Association in 
Denver.

Australian Meat Board of­
ficial Harry Bryant told 
American sheepmen that no 
large volume of Australian 
lamb could be expected to 
enter the U.S. market as long 
as Arab imports remained 
high. Of an estimated 42,000 
tons of lamb to be export­
ed from Australia this year, 
Bryant said that only about 
7,000 tons will be sent to 
countries outside the Mid­
east.

The majority of lamb im­
ported into the U.S. origi­
nates in New Zealand, how­
ever, and that country’s sales 
stateside have been avera­
ging about 20 million 
pounds. New Zealand Lamb 
Co. executive vice president 
Graham Lindsay told produc­
ers that gaining new lamb 
customers such as the Arabs 
benefits the U.S. lamb indus­
try as well as those of 
Australia and New Zealand. 
The implication, of course, is 
that without the slack taken 
up by the Mideast countries, 
New Zealand would have 
more lamb left to sell on the 
U.S. market. They currently 
sell about 60 percent of their 
exports to the United King­
dom, the remainder to the 
U.S., Canada, Japan, the 
European Common Market 
and of course, the Arabs.

Unlike most current lamb 
importers, the Arabs prefer 
to receive their lamb with the 
bleat still working. They do 
their own slaughtering after 
receiving in order to have 
fresh, not chilled or frozen, 
meat. This live shipping 
trend is expected to change 
as the Arabs become more 
accustomed to the chilled or 
frozen product, and as Aus­
tralian exporters bow to ru­
mored labor union com­
plaints.

Union plant workers are 
reportedly considerably up­
set over the loss of poten­
tial work because of live 
shipping rather than carcass 
trade.

At any rate, though U.S. 
sheepmen may cuss the Ar­
abs over the high price of 
pickup fuel, they could owe 
them a thank you when their 
sheep go to market.

STORAGE 
BOXES

SIZES 12”X15”X ir -E X T R A  STRONG

Records — Clothes — Toys — Stuff Compact — P ortab le

Hats, Blankets, Rem nants, Seasonal Use M aterials 
E xtra  Strong -  M ade of New FIBRE-COR

WITH 100 AND 1 USES
Use it to store Household or 

Office Records, Clothes

Holds Up To 150 Pounds 

Both Letter or Legal Size Record Storage

$2.25
A t The

STOCKMAN

Amraal San 
Angelo Rodeo 
Coming Up
The 45th Annual San An­

gelo Stock Show and Rodeo is 
slated for Wednesday 
through Sunday, March 8-12, 
at the San Angelo fair­
grounds and coliseum. The 
combined event is sponsored 
by the San Angelo Stock 
Show and Rodeo Association.

The stock show will con­
tinue from Wednesday 
through Saturday. Deadline 
for entering livestock is Feb­
ruary 8.

Concerning the stock 
show, association president 
Gene Newman has announc­
ed several changes that have 
been made this year. In the 
steer show, new judging 
methods will be used. In 
addition, two new shows in 
the Junior Breeding Heifers, 
new classes in the Goat 
Show, and a Neatness Award 
have been added.

Rodeo performances are 
scheduled for Thursday, Fri­
day, and Saturday nights and 
Friday, Saturday, and Sun­
day afternoons. Featured 
performers at the rodeo will 
be Jody Miller,, Grammy 
award winning country sing­
er, and Rex Allen, Jr., the 
man who is said to have “ put 
the Western back in the 
Country Sound.”

Miss Miller, in her tra­
vels across the nation, has 
appeared with many of the 
major stars in show bus­
iness including Roy Clark, 
Tony Orlando and Dawn, and 
Bob Hope. A native and

NOTICE OF

REW ARD
I am  offering

$500 Reward
for apprehension and convic­
tion of gnilty parties to every 
dieft of livestock in Crockett 
County • except that no 
ofiBcer of Crockett County 
may claim the reward.

Billy Mills
Sheriff, Crockett Co.

current resident of Oklaho­
ma, Miss Miller has recordv 
ed albums entitled “ Good 
News!” , “ He’s So Fine” , 
“There’s a Party Goin’ On” , 
“ Country Girl” , and “ House 
of the Rising Sun” .

Allen, referred to as a 
trend setter in Country Mu­
sic, began his career at age 
13. Since then he has become 
a television entertainer and 
has had 11 national chart 
records with “ Goodbye” and 
“ Can You Hear Those Pio­
neers” going into the top 10 
nationally.

Other scheduled activities 
will include a carnival each 
afternoon and night of the 
five-day event and a parade 
set for downtown San Angelo 
Friday, March 10.

All of us have memories., that are worthy of 
cherishing. The same is true of our family names. They 
are worth cherishing and preserving. Your family 
memorial is one of the most imporiaht ways of doing 
this.  ̂ '>

We have a complete selection of various styles and
sizes.

Just come by or call at your next convenience.

Coleman Monument Works
DAVID HUFF-Owner

-A -----  ^ W: IcT

CHRYSLER
Cordoba 2-Door Hardtop

NEW STYLING TOUCHES , 
IMPROVED FUEL EFFICIENCY
FOR 1978 CHRYSLER CORDOBA

■'.xi i

T ly m o u t f i

Dodgejrucks

The Cordoba, Chrysler’s highly successful mid-size luxury car, combines a neW inside and 
outside look, even more elegance and greater fuel efficiency for 1978.

Exterior styling improvements include a new front-«nd panel and grill, headlamps, 
taillamps, optional cornering lamps, deck lid, rear bumper and full-length sill molding. 
Inside, there are new seats, new upholsteries and trims, and many features to contribute to 
pleasurable motoring.

Mechanical improvements to provide better fuel economy and other benefits have been 
made in the torque converter, automatic transmission, and the fuel and electrical systems.

“We feel that the many improvements in the 1978 Cordoba will attract a Iwge number of 
owners of larger cars who are accustomed to luxury, but who want a smaller, more 
fuel-efficient car. i"; .

Also Full Stock O f GOODYEAR Yir^s |

1978 1/2-Ton GMC T R U tK
Check our Prices f irsi!

CARLISLE
Ozona,Texas 807 11th ST.

CO
392-3110
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QZ^I^A BASKETBALL

S c h t d N ie

LIONS UONETTES

^ e b .9 Sonora F Here 5:30
^Feb. 10 Kennit A-B A-B There 6:15
Feb. 10 Iraan A-B There 6:30
Fieb.l4 Sonora A-B Here 5:00
•Feb. 17 Crane There 6:15

d. Ĉ - - ' B. A vf: '

M

ThefoMowiRf Iw iBMtfinis Art locking The liois All The Way: Village Drug Hiway Cafe
* ■ V

Circle Bar Tra^ J l ip Bina’s Poco Taco , Ozona Oil Ozona Shell

Bailey Tin C l. , 6UU SEIF SERVICE »Kyle Kleaners Ozona Electric & Carpet

Cbamber i f  C iM M R i. ' ./f 4 Thorp's Laun-Dry d Baggett Agency Norma’s Country Kitchen
Ozena N a t io N lj i i L B Motor Co. J Maness Texaco lim’s Foodway
Southwest 'B l’ T M  Stop Nicks Chevron Station Western Auto Stuart Motor

Ozona Butane Cl.! . ̂ A''
Crockett Welding B lu s t . * Moore Oil Adobe Mini-Mart

Mayfield CN S lnB lIii South Texas Lmbr. Co. White’s Auto Westerman Drug

Ranch Feed 1 S^Mf C. G. Morrison Co. Montya Exxon lay Miller Const.

Cannon Air Ozona Quick Stop The Line
" . r̂. ■ = ' 'ti- •,
S. / 'f - Chato’s Restaurant

Ozona T-V SysliB J. W. Motor Parts i  l^ ow n Furniture Co. M & M Cafe
Broadway Be l B & C Automotive ” ^^Liiiy Welding & Const. Crockett Co. Water Dist.
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LETTERS TO 
THE EDITOR

February 2,1978
Dear Kitty,

Your newspaper printed a 
letter in the February 1, 
edition, which asked people 
to write to the FCC to pro­
test an alleged petition by 
Madalyn Murray O’Hair. A 
bit of research reveals that 
there is no such petition 
before the FCG. Ms. O’Hair 
has never filed such a peti­
tion. The petition number- 
RM2493-was filed by two 
California men in 1974, ahrf 
was directed to ‘public’, and 
not ‘commercial’ tv program­
ming. The FCC duly ruled 
negative on that petition. 
Since that time, nothing on 
the issue has been present­
ed to that group.

The intent of the letter 
printed last week was worth­
while, but unnecessary. It is 
a dead issue.

Sincerely,
Larry E. Bailey

hibit A of the suit Soste- 
nes de Hoyos has filed 
against Jess Marley.

I am a Mexican Citizen. I 
Jiave neither registered nor 
voted. I live with my wife 
Aurora at 601 5th St., which I 
believe is in Precinct 2. 

Thank you, ^
Heriberto G. Gutierrez 
P.O. Box 1321 
Ozona, Texas

Crockett Co 
Hospital News

Patients receiving treat­
ment in the Crockett County 
Hospital during the past 
week are the following: 

Elvira Higginbottom*
Ted Lewis*
Thomas A. Bailey 
Michael L. White, Big 

Lake
' ’ Peter Jones Stewart, Lub­
bock

Zopopan DeHoyos* 
Frances Borrego 
Hazel Prosise 
Helen Ratliff 

♦denotes dismissals

Tax Savings May Be Available 
To Texas Farmers & Ininchers

^ Cornbread
CAFETERIA MENlIi Thursday

____ ■___  ' Chicken Pie

*  - February 7,1978
Dear Kitty,
; Re: Emergency Feed Pro­

gram
The deadline to file an 

application for Emergency 
Feed has been extended to 
February 15, 1978.

Sincerely,
Corleen S. Meyer 
Acting CED 
Crockett County ASCS

Dear Mrs. Montgomery:
I would like to tell the 

people who think I voted in 
the Special Election, I am not 
the Heriberto Gutierrez in 
the list of voters in the Ex-

REMINDER TO RANCHERS
The Texas Parks and Wild­

life Dept, urges the Crockett 
County landowners to please 
complete their record books 
and anterless deer post card 
survey in order that the 1977 
hunting season data may be 
compiled.

MISS WILLIAMS ON 
DEANS UST AT UT

Miss Suzanne Williams, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Williams, has been not­
ified she made the acade­
mic Dean’s Honor List at the 
University of Texas at Aus­
tin for the fall semester.

Miss Williams is a senior 
student majoring in Clinical 
Psychology.

ACE CLIPPER undulated 
staples, for use with clipper 
pliers, SALE $1.90. THE 
STOCKMAN OFHCE.

Buy your Razor Point Pilot 
pen at The Ozona Stockman.

I LOVE YOU / /

Tell Her With 
Flowers

VALENTINE DAY
Feb. 14

Pot Plants 
Cut Flowers

r

MAXINES FLOWERS
701 FIRST PH. 392-2648
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Record Your Memories 

In Living Color ot the

SPRING
R O U N D -U P  DANCE 

F E B .18
Coll Now For Appointment

Sondra
392-3103

The Cameras Two
392-2256

Income tax savings may be 
available to Texas farmers 
and ranchers who suffered 
losses due to summer heat 
and drought.

That informatioriy comes 
from Dr. Richard Jrimble, 
economist in management 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

“ Normally, the sale or 
trade of livestock, if held 
primarily for sale, produces 
ordinary farm income that 
should be reported in the 
year it is received. However, 
a rancher may be able to 
elect to defer reporting in­
come from the sale of cer­
tain livestock because of 
drought conditions which oc­
curred during 1977,’’ points 
out Trimble.

To qualify for this elec­
tion, the rancher must use 
the cash method of account­
ing and the livestock must be 
held primarily for sale. Ano­
ther condition is that the area 
or county must be designa­
ted as eligible for Oiassis- 
tance by the federal govern­
ment due to the drought 
conditions.

“This special treatment is 
limited to income front live­
stock which is sold or ex­
changed in excess of the 
usual sales each year. The 
income can be deferred for 
only one year,’’ explains the 
economist.

Trimble cites an example. 
Rancher Smith normally sells 
50 head of feeder cattle each 
year. In 1977, because of the 
drought, he sold 70 head of 
the feeder cattle sold 
($4,000) and report it on his 
1978 income tax return. 
Smith must use the cash 
method of accounting, live in 
an eligible area, and depend 
on farming or ranching as his 
principal occupation.

Special provisions also ap­
ply to drought-forced sales of 
breeding livestock, notes the 
economist. When livestock 
held for draft, breeding or 
dairy purposes are sold or 
exchanged solely because of 
drought, their disposition is 
considered an involuntary 
conversion. Only livestock 
sold in excess of the number 
normally sold under uslj

Chris 
392-3106

business practices in the 
absencis of i^^ought will be 
considered iwoluntarily con­
verted. The gain on livestock 
involuntarily? converted into 
money will not be taxed in 
th^^year of the salfe if the 
converted property is replac­
ed within two years.

How are farmers affected?
“ Farmers may be able to 

elect to defer for one year the 
reporting of crop insurance 
payments from the tax year 
the crops were destroyed or 
damaged by drought,’’ says 
Trimble. “ A farmer can de­
fer reporting such income if 
he can establish that under 
normal practice, the crop 
destroyed would have been 
sold in the following tax year. 
This provisi^ should help 
provide a non^al income flow 
for the indisrrc^al farmer wife 
qualifies;’’ ~

There n i|y  be $oj^e 
drought rela^d losses that 
are not deductible, points oUt 
Trimble. The loss of grow­
ing crops for a farmer using 
the cash metHod of account­
ing is not a deductible in­
come tax loss. Thi§ Ts be­
cause the costs of the jpEb- 
ductive inputs such as seed, 
fertilizer and insecticide are 
deducted as farm expenses. 
The same rule applies to the 
loss of raised livestock where 
the cost of raising has been 
deducted as farm expense.

Publication ^o. 22Si’̂ ^Far- 
mer’s Tax Guide,’’ 1978 
Edition, is a good sdurce pf 
information ar^ may be ob­
tained from any county Ejtt 
tension agent or the Internal 
Revenue Service, adds the 
economist. v ■

Mbnday
Spaghetti and Meat Sauce 
Buttered Peas 
Lettuce Salad 
Fruit Cup 
Hot Rolls 

'Tuesday
Barbecue on Bun 
Potato Salad
Carrot and Raisin Salad 
Fruit Cup 

Wednesday 
Pinto Beans 
Stuffed Weiners 
Cabbage Salad 
Chocolate Peanuts

Buttered Carrots 
Vegetable Salad 
Fruit Gelatin 
Bread

PAGE SEVEN

Friday
Fried Steak and Gravy 
Mashed Potatoes 
Vegetable Salad 
Fruit Cup 
Hot Rolls

heaven and eapth w ill pass away, nut my wocos shall not pass away
mart oa is

.ORSON WELLES Based on the booh by HAL LINDSEY wilhCC CARLSON

A PACIFIC INTERNATIONAL ENTERPRISES RELEASE • ccorbyCFi

SHOWS TUESDAY FEB. 14 
ONE DAY O N LY

BIG 0 ’ THEATRE
TWO SHOWINGS-7;00 P.M. AND 9:00 P.M.

FIRE d e pa r t m e n t  
AUXILIARY MEETS

The Ladies Auxiliary of 
the Fire Department met 
Monday night at the Fire 
Station. Members present 
were Mrs. Mike Miller, Mrs. 
Jerry Hill, Mrs. L.A. Mc- 
Caleb and Mrs. David Cooke.

The next meeting will be 
March 6 at the Fire Sta­
tion. All firemen’s wives are 
(Unvitdli to atter

OZONA QUICK STOP
South of I-IO in Ozona

OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK 
24 HDURS A DAY

Special on Anti Freeze 
Self-Service Gas Groceries Ice

Drawing every Mon. for $10 
worth of FREE groceries.

Everyone welcome to register.
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VILLAGE SHOPPJIIG 
CENTER O ZO N A .
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Sen. John Tower Announces 
For Re-Election To Senate

The time has come for the 
decision making process to 
begin. The people must de­
cide, in the next eleven 
months, who best reflects 
their hopes and their aspir­
ations, for themselves and 
their children in the Senate 
of the United States.

No one, who is intellec­
tually honest, and who loves 
his fellow citizens, would 
aspire to serve in so impor­
tant a body as the United 
States Senate without ap­
proaching the undertaking in 
all humility. To represent 
one’s people, to speak for 
them in matters great and 
small, is a high honor and an 
enormous responsibility that 
have to be felt to be under- 
stood-and I want all Tex­
ans to know that I am aware 
of that honor and that res­
ponsibility every waking mo­
ment of my life and I am 
grateful for the confidence 
you have reposed in me.

In that spirit, conscious of 
all that lies ahead, and con­
fident of the good judgement 
of an informed people, I 
today offer myself for re- 
election to a fourth term as 
United States Senator for 
Texas.

abiding love for Texas and 
her people. I have been in all 
254 counties of this “ em­
pire wide and glorious’’, this 
great land that strikes so 
deeply in us all a sense of 
gladness and infinite pride.

I am going to carry this 
campaign into every corner 
of our great state in the 
coming months and return to 
as many of those counties 
as time and circumstances 
will permit. I will present the 
issues as I see them—con­
fident that when the people 
make their decision it will be 
made on the basis of the 
issues and on the records and 
credibility of those in the 
race.

I will speak with candor.
I will appeal to our far- 

mers-who are now being 
driven from their farms be­
cause of economic policies 
that make it practically im­
possible for them to exist as 
independent operators.

I will appeal to our small 
businessmen who are being 
driven to distraction by a 
horde of government regula­
tors and regulations.

I will appeal to our edu­
cators and parents who have 
seen their classrooms given

I have a profound and over to social experimenta-

“ D A V i i i s i ” ’  
ARCO

Full Service
A t Self Service 

Prices
56.9 Reg.
59.9 Uirleaded

Texas Tire Sealer Firestone Tires 
Wheel Balancing Flats Fixed

CuatrO Davidson Proprietor 
OZONA 101 Ave. E. TEXAS

tion rather than learning.
I will appeal to our work­

ing people who do not wish to 
be forced, against their will, 
to pay dues to eastern labor 
bosses before they can get or 
hold jobs in this state.

I will appeal to our senior 
citizens who have seen the 
purchasing power of their 
retirement income dwindle in 
the face of constant infla­
tion.

I will appeal to our young 
who ask only for the oppor­
tunity of upward mobility in a 
stable society.

I will appeal to those 
ethnic minorities of our state 
who want to take their right­
ful place in our free enter­
prise system.

I will appeal to those who 
are concerned about our 
national security at a time 
when the Soviet Union is out­
stripping us in so many as­
pects of modern warfare.

And finally, to all those 
Texans, in every walk of life, 
of every race, color or creed, 
who long for the day when 
the heavy hand of govern­
ment shall be lightened, and 
the oppressive army of reg­
ulators, bureaucrats, and 
tax-eaters once again enter 
the private work force of a 
free society.

As you are aware I have 
not been a shrinking violet in 
Washington when it comes to 
fighting for the interests of 
Texas and her people. There 
are many people there repre­
senting vested interests and 
an entrenched bureaucracy 
who would like to see my 
voice stilled and my vote 
silenced. They have their 
minions in Texas as well. It is 
frustrating to them to have a 
spokesman for the great and 
powerful state of Texas stand 
in the way of their efforts to 
regiment our society and 
plunder our resources.

It is frustrating for them to 
have a political leader from 
this state stand in the way of 
their plan to give away the 
Panama Canal.

It is frustrating to them to 
have in this state an effec­
tive opponent for their ul­
timate plans to repeal our 
right to work laws.

It is frustrating for them to 
have someone around who is 
not afraid to point out the 
folly of their inflationary 
economic policies.

For all these reasons and 
more they have targeted me 
for defeat in 1978.

They would like nothing 
more than to be able to trum­
pet to the world that Tex­
ans have repudiated a 
champion of individual liber­
ty and national strength.

But I say to you now that 
with your help that message 
will not go out.

d n i M M y i i r

Hurry, only I left

Also

LINE UP OF ONE/
\  O W N E R  U SED  C A R S ! /

L-B MOTOR CO

The message that will go 
out when this campaign is 
done will say to the nation 
and the world that Tex­
ans have reaffirmed their 
devotion to principles that 
have made this country great 
and have given its people 
hope for the future.

The road ahead is long and 
arduous. The forces arrayed 
against us are powerful and 
cunning. Victory will require 
untiring effort on the part of 
all of us. I promise you my 
own unflagging dedication 
and effort. But we will need 
your support, your labors, 
your strength of conviction 
and that of thousands more 
like you all across Texas, to 
see this through. Together 
we will prevail.

Wise Family
Spending
Decisions

Wise spending decisions 
in families depend on both 
husband and wife, says Clau­
dia Kerbel, consumer infor­
mation specialist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A«feM 
University System.

Since both partners make a 
significant number of deci­
sions together, it is impor­
tant for both to practice ef­
fective decision-m aking  
skills, she adds.

Decision-making involves 
value clarification, goal set­
ting, examining alternative 
uses of resources, choosing 
wisely and evaluating the 
outcome of a decision, the 
specialist continues.

Below are the findings of a 
recent study to determine 
who-husbands or wives-had 
major responsibility for de­
cisions about housing, trans­
portation and food.

Findings showed that 
transportation decisions re­
lated to age and length of 
marriage. In younger couples 
and those who had been 
married a short time, both 
spouses made the major 
transportation decisions. 
Among older couples and 
those married longer, hus­
bands made more decisions.

Decision making Tor food 
choices ‘was related tO' the'; 
wife’s contribution to the in­
come. The greater her finan­
cial contribution, the fewer 
food-buying decisions she 
made.

In 75 percent of the fam­
ilies, major housing deci­
sions were made by both 
husband and wife, Ms. Ker­
bel says.

Medicare Deductible To Go 
Up For 1978 Benefit Periods

Ozona,Texas Jerry Lay Phene 392-2691

Pilot Razor Point Pens in 
three colors at The Ozona 
Stockman office.

The Medicare hospital in­
surance deductible will be 
$144 for benefit periods be­
ginning in 1978, Franklin H. 
Upp, social security manager 
in San Angelo, said today. 
This represents an increase 
of $20 over the $124 de­
ductible effective during 
1977.

The deductible is the 
amount people pay towards 
the cost of services covered 
by Medicare hospital insur­
ance during the first 60 days 
of hospital care provided 
during a benefit period. The 
increase will not affect peo­
ple whose benefit periods 
began in 1977, Mr. Upp 
added, but will apply to 
people who start a benefit 
period in 1978.

A benefit period is the way 
of measuring a person’s use 
of services under Medicare 
hospital insurance. A per­
son’s first benefit period 
starts when he or she enters 
a hospital after hospital in­
surance begins. It ends when 
the person has been out of 
the hospital or other facil­
ity primarily providing skill­
ed nursing or rehabilitation 
services for 60 days in a row. 
There is no limit to the 
number of benefit periods a 
person can have.

The increase in the de­
ductible will also cause in­
creases in the other coin­
surance amounts people are 
responsible for under Medi-

Food Buying 
Habits Focus 
On Nutrition

Consumer food buying ha­
bits focus on using nutrition 
and buying principals when 
shopping, says Mary K. 
Sweeten, foods and nutri­
tion specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, The Texas A&M Un­
iversity System.

Some 66 percent of those 
surveyed always checked 
food labels for ingredients 
listed before buying it. Nu­
tritional information was util- 
 ̂jzed, by 59 j^ercqnt.v^,. . , 
r; Food shopping hai)its in 

T977 compared to the 1976 
shopping habits showed that 
31 percent almost always 
shopped more than one store 
for the best prices and 23 
percent sometimes did this, 
Mrs. Sweeten continues.

This survey was conducted 
by the USD A Economic Re­
search Service-and it shows 
that many consumers are 
taking advantage of nutrition 
information and other con­
veniences in the market 
place.
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care hospital insurance, Mr. 
Upp said.

For the 61st through the 
90th day of hospital care, the 
patient will be responsible 
for paying $36 a day, up from 
the $26 a day rate for 1977. 
For each of the 60 “ re­
serve’’ hospital days avail­
able to people with Medi­
care, the patient will be 
responsible for $72 a day. 
For the 21st through the 
100th day of care in a skilled 
nursing care facility available 
in a benefit period, the 
patient will be responsible 
for paying $18, up from the 
$15.50 paid in 1977 benefit 
periods.

The staff in the San An­
gelo Social Security Office 
will be glad to answer any 
questions people have about

Medicare and the new de­
ductible. The office is loca­
ted at 2214 Sherwood Way. 
The telephone number is 
949-4608. Residents of Big 
Lake, Brady, Junction, Ma­
son, Ozona, Sonora, Win­
ters, and Ballinger can call 
toll free by dialing “ Opera­
tor” and asking for “ En­
terprise 2058” .

WESTERN MATTRESS 
COMPANY 

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 
Mattresses new or 

renovated
Box Springs-Choice of 

Sizes and Firmness 
AU Woric Guaranteed 

392-2031

YARNS-ARTS & CRAFTS 
NEEDLE POINT-MACRAME 

LATCH HOOK
Sheny Holt 

THE YARN BARN
MON.-FRI. 10-12 & 1-5:30 SAT. 1-5:30

322 Ave. I Ph. 392-3097

PUBLIC NOTICE
INDUSTRIAL TOOL & MACHINERY DISPOSAL SALE

SUNDAY, FEB. 12TH ONLY-9 A.M.-7P.M.

CHICAGO POWER-CHICAGO PNEUMATIC-ROCKWELL-RODAC- 
WATERLOO-BLUELINE-ALLIED INDUSTRIAL-In view of current fiscal 
trends, our company will immediately dispose of a large portion of its 
inventory at a b'action of the original cost [25% to 75%]. Over 200 
DIFFERENT TYPES OF BRAND NEW HAND TOOLS, AIR TOOLS, 
ELECTRIC TOOLS AND CUTTING TOOLS OBVIOUSLY CANNOT BE 
LISTED HERE. However, here are just a few examples.

1/2 ’ ’ DRIVE AIR IMPACT WRENCHES $49.50
1” DRIVE AIR IMPACT $187.50
3/8” DRIVE AIR RATCHET $39.50
GRAY DUCT TAPE,60 Yd. roUs $2.25 ea.
2 H.P. COMPRESSOR, 20 gal. tank $259.50
V2 H.P. BENCH GRINDERS OSHA APPROVED $49.50
DUAL PISTON AIR FILE $59.50
12” CUT OFF SAW $199.50
2 TON POWER PULLS $22.97
6” SWIVEL BASE INDUSTRIAL VISES, weight 80 lbs. $59.50
INDUSTRIAL DRILL PRESSES $169.50
3/4 ’ ’ DRIVE SOCKET SETS $69.50
MILLING MACHINE $1900.00

PLUS DRILL PRESSES, AIR COMPRESSORS, BENCH GRINDERS, 
VISES USA-HHS TWIST DRILLS, AIR IMPACT WRENCHES TO 1” 
DRIVE, SANDERS, GRINDERS, SOCKET SETS, WRENCH SETS, Etc.,
Etc., Etc..... ALL MERCHANDISE IN ORIGINAL PACKAGING, WITH
FACTORY GUARANTEES. Limited Supply. First come, first served.

SEMI-TRUCK LOAD SALE
INN OFTHE WEST 

EXIT 365 AND INT. 10 
OZONA, TEXAS

til'] Public Invited-Terms: Cash’Oir Chech;

SUPER Sonic

A LL TIRES REDUCED

57o^
TIRES IN STOCK  |

Tires In STOCK!

Good Selection of the Windsor 2+2 |
which carry a ROAD HAZARD Guarantee !
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a  o f f  on  a l l  
AMERICAN

RACING WHEELS
s p e c ia l

o rd e r s  w i l l  b e  ta k e n

Sale Ends Feb 25th

BAILEY TIRE CO.
392-3404 Corner of 10th & Ave f 392.2147

OK Firestone Windsor I
—
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Proper Planting Of 
Trees Is Important

January through February 
is an ideal time to select 
shade or ornamental trees for 
planting so that they can 
become established prior to 
spring growth. But tree 
planting should be done with 
care.

To begin, select a tree that 
suits your particular land­
scape needs, says Billy Rea- 
gor. County Agent. Before 
buying, ask yourself these 
questions: Will there be ade­
quate room for the tree when 
it reaches maturity? Will it fit 
the existing landscape? Is it 
to be used for shade, screen­
ing, wind protection, or just 
to balance the landscape?

Choose a tree that is well 
adapted to area soils and

weather extremes. Consider 
possible insect problems 
such as elm leaf beetles, 
common to various elm spe­
cies, and disease suscepti­
bilities such as anthracnose, 
common to sycamore trees.

The potential tree buyer 
will have to choose between 
deciduous and evergreen 
trees. Deciduous trees pro­
vide shade in summer and 
shed their leaves to let 
sunlight through in winter. 
Evergreen plants provide 
shading and screening the 
year-round but do not change 
color or texture in the fall.

After selecting the tree, 
make certain it’s planted cor­
rectly, emphasizes Reagor. 
Start out by making sure the

THANK YOU

To our many friends in 
Ozona who made our years 
in the automobile selling 
and servicing business so 
enjoyable and so successful. 
We appreciate your patron­
age and look forward to 
many more years of friend­
ship.

We sold the business 
Feb. 1, to Dub Carlisle, and 
sincerely believe you will 
have the same good service 
under his management.

Again, our heartfelt 
appreciation to our former 
patrons.

B. W. and Wanda Stuart

planting hole is large enough 
for the root system.

For a bare-root tree, make 
the hole large enough to 
allow the root system to 
spread out naturally. It 
should be deep enough for 
the plant to set no deeper 
than its original soil level- 
slightly higher (1-2 inches) is 
even better. Next, trim brok­
en or damaged roots, and 
then form a mound in the 
bottom of the planting hole, 
letting the roots flow down 
the mound. Do not allow 
roots to dry out.

For a balled-and-burlap- 
ped tree, dig the hole about 
one-and-a-half times the dia­
meter of the ball. Plant it so 
that the top of the soil ball is 
at or slightly above the exist­
ing soil surface.

Finally, prune the tops of 
transplanted trees to com­
pensate for loss of roots. As a 
general rule, prune about 
one-third of the top growth. 
Then fill the hole with a good 
soil mixture such as peat 
moss and topsoil and water 
thoroughly.

As your newly planted tree 
begins to grow, you can feel 
proud of improving your 
landscape and environment, 
adds Reagor.

Embroidery 
Program 
Starts Tues.

The Crockett County Fam­
ily Living Committee is spon­
soring a special program on 
Machine Embroidery on 
Tuesday night, February 14, 
7:00 p.m. at the Ozona 
Community Center.

Mrs. Doan, of the Viking 
Sewing Center in San Ange­
lo will present the program. 
The program will feature free 
hand machine embroidery. 
Both straight stitch and zig­
zag machines will be demon­
strated.

The demonstration will al­
so feature embroidery on 
special fabrics like terry 
cloth. She will also show how 
to make your own braid.

The latest techniques on 
embroidery with your ma­
chine will be presented. All 
homemakers are welcome re­
gardless of race, creed, col­
or, sex, religion, national 
origin, or socio-economic lev­
els.

Dr. and Mrs. Ralph Simon 
and Millie of El Paso, were 
visitors in Ozona over the 
weekend in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Carson and Mr. 
and Mrs. James Childress.

A Lift For The Week
We hear too much about 

higher standards of living 
and not enough about higher 
standards of life.

Party Honors Political 
The Carnes’ Gifts May 
Retirement Be Deductible

RUDY MARTINEZ 
Boxing Winner

Ozona Boy 
Undefeated 
In Boxing

Rudy Martinez was the 
lone winner for the Ozona 
Boxing Team in a tourna­
ment held in Del Rio, Sat­
urday. He scored a knock­
down in the first round and 
knocked his opponent out in 
the second round.

Rudy is a freshman at 
Ozona High School, and one 
of the best boxers in this 
area, according to boxing 
coach Coy Tambunga, hav­
ing 4 wins and no losses.

He will fight in the Odes­
sa Golden Gloves tourna­
ment Feb. 9-11 along with six 
other Ozona boxers, Simon 
Hernandez, Gino Tambunga, 
Pete Guerra, Robert Flor­
es, Marcelo Hernandez and 
Hector DeLaGarza.

The boys will fight in the 
junior high and high school 
divisions. The tournament 
will be held at the Ector 
County Coliseum and Chan­
nel 4 will televise the mat­
ches each night at 7:30.

Mr. and Mrs. S.E. Car­
nes were honored with a re­
tirement party Jan. 21 at the 
Civic Center. Mr. Carnes 
retired after 35 years and 5 
months with Shell Oil Co.

Attending were their chil­
dren, Ron Carnes of Okla­
homa City, Okla., Mrs. P.A. 
Carnes of Chicago, 111. and 
Mr. and Mrs. Michael Riggs 
of San Diego, Calif.

Others attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Millard Pierce of 
Electra, Mr. and Mrs. Wel­
don Moore of Hobbs, N.M., 
Mr. and Mrs. Russ Calnen of 
Midland, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Lowery of Midland, Mr. and 
Mrs. Seldon Jones, Mr. and 
Mrs. Curt Schroeder, Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Adcock, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Bell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Chester Wilson, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Crow­
der, Mr. and Mrs. Don St. 
Clair, Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Burger, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Hester, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bud Coates, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lonnie Dorris, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Shaw and J.R. 
McCartney.

Mr. and Mrs. Carnes will 
continue to make their home 
in Ozona, where they have 
resided for 30 years.

r  ^
REMEMBER 

THOSE 
YOU LOVED 

WITH A
MEMORIAL GIFT 

TO THE 
AMERICAN 

CANCER 
SOCIETY I

Mr. and Mrs. F.H. White- 
head, Jr. in memory of Mrs. 
S.A. Man.

Mr. and Mrs. L.D. Kirby 
in memory of Mrs. Tom 
Mitchell, Mrs. Mary Man, 
Mr. W.P. Varga, Jerry 
Christensen.

Mr. and Mrs. John Chil­
dress in memory of Mrs. Sam 
Man.

Mr. and Mrs. James Chil­
dress in memory of Mrs. 
S.A. Man.

Mr. and Mrs. M.W. Tooke 
in memory of Tissie Mitchell, 
Tommie Womack, Lawrence 
Janes.

Jay Miller Construction 
Co. in memory of Tissie 
Mitchell.

The R.L. Bland Family in 
memory of Mrs. Tom Mit­
chell.

Mrs. Dorothy Friend in 
memory of Mrs. Minnie 
Murphey, Mrs. S.A. Man, 
Mr. Bill Varga, Mrs. Mar­
garet Box.

Memorials Chairman
Mrs. Charlie Balck

Political contributions 
made in 1977 may qualify for 
either a tax deduction or a 
tax credit, the Internal Rev­
enue Service said.

To qualify for tax purpos­
es, the contribution must 
have been used for poli­
tical activities directly relat­
ed to a campaign of an 
announced candidate, a poli­
tical committee, or a news­
letter fund.

A taxpayer can choose to 
take either a tax deduction 
up to $100 ($200 on a joint 
return) or a tax credit that 
will reduce his or her tax bill 
by one-half of the contribu­
tion up to $25 ($50 on a joint 
return). When choosing the 
deduction, however, the tax­
payer must itemize deduc­
tions.

Contributions that qualify 
for deductions or credits 
include cash paid directly to 
a candidate or political com­
mittee and tickets to various 
political parties and dinners. 
Taxpayers buying tickets can 
deduct or take credit based 
on the full cost of tickets 
purchased for this purpose.

An event must be primar­
ily political in nature, with 
the major portion of time de­
voted to political speeches or 
discussion in order for fees to 
be fully deductible for tax 
purposes. The event must 
also be in support of an 
announced political candi­
date.

If the event is only par­
tially political and its main 
purpose is to confer benefits 
to individuals attending, the 
taxpayer attending may take 
a deduction or credit for the 
total cost minus the fair 
market value of iany benefits 
gained, such as dinner or 
entertainment.

Raffle tickets purchased in 
connection with political 
fund-raisers do not qualify 
for the deduction or credit, 
according to the IRS.

Taxpayers should keep 
good records, such as written 
receipts and cancelled 
checks, to substantiate the 
tax deduction or credit for a 
political contribution.

An Italian immigrant to 
New Jersey, Italo Marcioni, 
p r o d u c e d  the first ice 
cream cones. The invention 
attracted little attention.

Reddy Tips 
To Help\bo...

% STRETCM

Y o u r  i m S ?  D o l la r s

Use your 
Refrigerator Wisely...

Open and close the refrigerator and freezer doors 
only when necessary. Several items can be removed 
at once to reduce loss of cold air.

"k Freezers and refrigerators operate most efficiently 
when filled to the correct capacity. Foods should 
be placed slightly apart on refrigerator shelves for 
correct circulation.

Cover all liquids stored in the refrigerator (espe-' 
cia lly frost-free models). Moisture is drawn into 
the air from uncovered liquids making the refriger­
ator work harder.

^ B e  sure your appliance is standing level so that 
the door seals properly. By setting a glass of water 
on the top, you can see if it is level.

Pick up your FREE copy of 
‘ ■ENERGY CONSERVATION”

Booklet from

Big] Fkigidaire
Home Environment Division of General Motors.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Member of The Central and South West System

1978 Texas Almanacs for 
sale at The Ozona Stockman.

Combat
Static
Electricity

Combat fly-away hair and 
clothes that cling to the body 
by eliminating static electri­
city, says Beverly Rhoades, 
clothing specialist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service, the Texas A&M 
University System.

Static electricity develops 
in items which do not effec­
tively conduct electricity--es- 
pecially when the air is dry, 
she explains.

To avoid static electricity 
in the hair (when the hair 
seems to follow the brush or 
comb) try a cream rinse on 
the hair or hair spray on the 
brush, and avoid excessive 
brushing-friction increases 
static build-up, the specia­
list suggests.

To reduce static cling in 
clothes, use a fabric soften­
er in the last rinse cycle or in 
the dryer, and avoid over- 
drying clothes. Slight damp­
ness enables the fabric to 
conduct electric current.

Or, try line drying rather 
than machine drying, she 
continues.

Also, commercial anti-sta­
tic products that can be 
sprayed directly on clothes 
are currently available.

Anti-static or anti-cling fa­
bric is particularly helpful in 
undergarments.

For emergencies, hair 
spray between a skirt, dress,- 
or hose and a synthetic slip 
will often eliminate static 
cling-at least temporarily, 
the specialist adds.

PLEASE!

Return Your 

Rendition Blank

To This Office Not Later Than 

April 30

YOU SHOULD HAVE RECEIVED YOUR RENDITION BLANKS 

THROUGH THE MAIL. YOU NEED TO UST PROPERTY NOT USTED, 

SIGN AND RETURN. PLEASE DO SO AS SOON AS POSSIBLE. 

IF YOU HAVE MADE ANY IMPROVEMENTS OR ADDITION TO YOUR 

PROPERTY, PLEASE UST SUCH IMPROVEMENTS OR ADDITIONS 

WITH THE COST OF SAME SO THAT WE CAN HGURE YOUR 

TAXES CORRECTLY.

Billy Mills
Tax Assessor & Collector Crockett County
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Cora lilley 
Funeral Sat. 
In Angelo

Funeral services for Mrs, 
Cora L. Lilley, 87, were held 
at 1 p.m. Sat., Jan. 28, in 
Johnson’s Funeral Home 
Chapel in San Angelo with 
graveside services in Pioneer 
Cemetery at Pioneer.

Mrs. Lilley died Jan. 26, in 
St. Johns Hospital in San 
Angelo after an illness.

She was born June 7, 1890 
in Callahan County. She was 
a nurse in Ozona for 23 years 
before moving from here.

Survivors include a son, 
three daughters, two bro­
thers, eight grandchildren 
and four great grandchil­
dren.

JUST ARRIVED-New ship­
ment quilted bedspreads, all 
sizes, washable, beautiful 
colors and designs. Some 
sizes, curtains to match. All 
popular priced. Visit our bed 
and bath shop, new mer­
chandise arriving daily. 
BROWN FURNITURE Co!

49-tfc

M&G WOOD COMPANY FOR SALE-House for sale. 
Firewood for sale, mes- 1776 sq. ft., $25,000. Also 

quite and oak. Call Blake piano, bedroom suite for 
Moody, 392-2547. 34-tfc sale. Phone 392-2048. 49-ltp

FOR SALE-500 gallon fuel 
tank and stand. See Glenn 
Burns. 4i_tfc

COMPRESSOR SYSTEMS 
INC.-Gas Compressor Me­
chanic, to live in Sonora, call 
Jim Castner, Midland, Tx., 
Phone 563-1170. 49-ltp

Valentine is coming up.
What to give that sweetheart 
in your life? A beautiful heart 
cake from Mity Nice Bakery. 
211 M esquite, 392-3129. 
Please order early. 45-tfc

OZONA GARDEN 
CLUB TO MEET

The Ozona Garden Club 
will meet Monday, Feb, 13, 
at the Civic Center at 12 noon 
for a sack lunch. Hostesses 
will be Mrs. J.B. Miller and 
Mrs. Bailey Post.

The program will be slides 
for the first Ozona Garden 
Club Flower Show, by Mrs. 
Wilma Carson.

GOING OUT OF BUSINESS-
Portable building, 12x24 red 
barn, only 1 left, $1,700, Call 
653-3741. 45-tfc

MISCELLANEOUS

WANT TOP DOLLAR for
your hunting? Let us lease 
your land for you. SPORT 
SHACK Ph. 392-2581. 49-tfc

FOR SALE-Residential lot. 
Country Club Estates, will 
consider any offer. Must sell. 
Phone 949-3001. 46-4tp

LOST&
FOUND

LOST-sorrel and tan male 
dog, 70 pounds, about 25 
inches high. Paw and tail 
tipped with white. Has collar 
and tags. Answers to name 
of Sandy. Missing since Jan. 
31 from Henderson Dr. 
REWARD. Contact Ray 
Boyd. 49-ltc

BUSINESS
SERVICES

Monuments &
Contact ORVAL 
392-2168.

Markers-
M A N E Y .

9-tfc

Desks, chairs, £Qes, safes, 
large selection. Save 20%- 
50%. Cash and Carry. 9:00- 
5 :3 0 , M o n d a y -F r id a y . 
VALUE CITY, 117 W. Two- 
hig. San Angelo, Texas.

15-tfc

SPECIAL ON WEDNES-
DAY S-Decorated cakes, 
shapes, characters, and 
special occasions. See at 
TRADE RITE GROCERY, or 
call Pam Wilson, 392-2442.

49-ltc

SAID Carol to Dwight, 
“ My carpets were a fright. 
Now they’re looking bright 
as I cleaned them right with 
Blue Lustre.’’ Perry Bros. 

___________49-ltc

PLUMBING

Mrs.Harvick’s 
Services In 
Gainesville

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Marjory Harvick, 55, were 
held Friday, Feb. 3, in 
Gainesville.

Mrs. Harvick died at her 
home in San Antonio early 
Wednesday of an apparent 
heart attack. She resided in 
Ozona from 1947 until 1962.

Survivors include her mot­
her, Mrs. Douglas (Peggy) 
Walton of Stone Mountain, 
Ga., and Mrs. Charles (Me­
lissa) Masters of Maumie, 
Ohio.

Savings Bond 
Sales Over 
’77 Quota

December sales of Series E 
and H United States Savings 
Bonds in Crockett County 
were reported today by 
County Bond Chairman Low­
ell Littleton. Sales for the 
twelve-month period totaled 
$30,425 for 101% of the 1977 
sales goal of $30,000.

Texas sales during the 
month amounted to 
$20,953,232, while sales for 
the twelve months of 1977 
totaled $283,011,461 with 
102% of the yearly sales goal 
of 276.9 million achieved.

BIG " 0 ”  
THEATRE

POUHCAL
COLUMN

Charges for announce­
ments must be paid in ad­
vance, and the same policy 
applies to all political adver­
tising carried in the columns 
of this newspaper.

Names for each office will 
be listed in the Political 
Column in the order that they 
are received at the News­
paper office.

The Ozona Stockman has 
been authorized to announce 
the following candidates for 
public office:
FOR 112TH 
DISTRICT JUDGE:

TROY WILLIAMS

CROCKETT COUNTY COM­
MISSIONER, PRECINCT 2: 

BILL T. WILLIAMS 
BILL BLACK
BYRON STUART

STATE SENATOR,
25TH DIST.:

PETE SNELSON

STATE REPRESENTATIVE 
70TH DIST.:

SUSAN GURLEY McBEE
CROCKETT COUNTY 
JUDGE:

JOHNNY JONES
COMMISSIONER, 
PRECINCT 4:

JESUS [CHUY] CASTRO

The Ozona Palette Club will 
meet February 14 at 6:30 
p.m. in Granny Miller Hall. 
Come ready to paint.

49-ltc

HELP
WANTEDAli

WANTED-Used mobile cat­
tle squeeze chute. Call 
392-2457. 49-tfc

HORSES-Buy, sell, or trade. 
Any kind, any number. Call 
915/345-2549, or 915/345- 
2275, Bob Stence; 915/345- 
2344, Gilbert Bell. 49-8tc

USED CARS

FOR SALE-’77 Buick Cen­
tury, loaded. Also boat, mo­
tor and trailer. And 2 wheel 
trailer and freezer. Call 
392-3112. 49-ltc

HELP WANTED-CASHIERS
2 truck stop cashiers needed 
for daytime shift. Apply in 
person to Liz Burrous, CIR­
CLE BAR TRUCK STOP. 
41-tfc

Oean Carpets give a heal­
thier, more pleasant atmos­
phere. Have your carpets 
been cleaned the “ Steam- 
liner” method in the last 
year? Let us do the hard 
work. Call 392-3038. Adcock 
Specialties, Ozona, Texas.

34-tfc

INDEPENDENT PLUMBING 
& REPAIR-No connection 
with any local firm. ED 
CADE-Phone 392-2786. 6-tfc

HELP WANTED-All types, 
night and morning shifts. 
Red Apple, apply in person 
at J.B. Miller & Co. 46-tfc

Will Do Sewing in my 
home. Phone 392-3034.47-4tc

WE BUY Aluminum Cans. 
GLENN SUTTON, 1103 Ave. 
H. 49-tfc

HELP WANTED-General 
kitchen help, cooks, wait­
resses, etc. also desk clerks, 
maids and general motel 
work. Apply in person, main 
lobby, Ozona Inn of the 
West, between 9 and 11:30 
a.m. and between 2 and 5 
p.m. 44-tfc

NOW you can steam clean 
carpets the professional way 
at a fraction of the cost with 
RINSENVAC. Peny Bros.

49-ltc

STRAIGHT TALK 
ABOUT CARPET 

Buying carpet is the 
third largest investment 
most people make, so do 
some looking around. See 
samples, compare prices 
and when you’ve made 
up your mind what kind 
of carpet you want, buy a 
well-known brand from a 
store yon trust. FIRTH- 
McGEE-BERVEN-PHIL- 
ADELPHIA-MONTICEL- 
LO.
BROWN FURNITURE 
CO.

HELP WANTED-Part time 
cocktail waitress at Circle 
Bar Club. Call 392-2637, Bill 
King. 39-tfc

FOR SALE-3 bedroom house 
in Eldorado, IV 2 bath, fire­
place, fenced yard on corner 
lot. Phone 853-2173. 48-2tc

OZONA LODGE NO. 747 
A. F. & A. M.

Reg. meeting on 
1st. Mon. of mo.

LOSE UGLY FAT
Start losing weight today OR 
MONEY BACK. MONADEX is a tiny 
tablet that will help curb your de­
sire for excess food. Eat less-weigh 
less. Contains no dangerous drugs 
and will not make you nervous. No 
strenuous exercise. Change your life 
. . . start today. MONADEX costs 
$3.25 for a 20 day supply and $5.50 
for twice the amount. Lose ugly fat 
or your money will be refunded with 
no questions asked by:

VILLAGE DRUG

Notice
Dr. and Mrs. Don L. Carlisle will attend a 

course on cardiac pacing and pacemakers at 
the University of Texas School of Medicine at 
San Antonio. The Oinic will be closed on 
Friday, February 10 and Saturday, February 
11. Clinic hours as usual Monday, February 
13.

HAYES
AUTO

REPAIR
Mechanic On Duty 

8 a.m.-6 p.m. 
1311 Ave. AA 

Phone 392-3224

SAW SHARPENING 
SERVICE

HAND SAWS-CIRCULAR SAWS 
CARBON-TIP BLADES- 

CHAIN SAW S- 

LAWNMOWER BLADES

Contact
FRED MAHANNAH

1207 Hereford Drive
392-2312 After 5:00 P.M.

& Weekends

H & C 
BUTANE
JERRY HAYES

Ozona
Sheffield

392-3225
836-4355

Nationally Advertised • Good Housekoopmg •)mowsESn. iituiD It

M orning  G lory
Back Relief' Mattresses

famous for Q ua lity  since 1903

Brown Furniture Co.

Ozona WaterweU Service
Dennis Clark 

392-3056
SUBMERGIBLE PUMP DISTRIBUTOR 

PUMP AND WINDMILL 
REPAIR AND SERVICE

I
I

J A Y  MILLER
CONSTRUCTION CO. 

General Dirt Contractor 
Oil Field Contracting

ROADS, LOCATIONS, PITS 
DOZERS, DUMPTRUCKS, MAINTAINERS

Brush Control 
Fast,Efficient Service

AIRPLANE SERVICE 
AVAILABLE

392-3243 Phone 392-2489

1
I
I

I
I

JO H N R JONES
Real Estate livestock

LOTS-HOUSES
AND

COMMERCIAL
BUY AND SELL 392-2113

TOM MONTGOMERY
R EPRESEN TATIVE

Life Health
AMERICAN NATIONAL INSURANCE COMPANY
P. O. BO X 370 
O ZO N A . TEXA S 76943 
BUS: 915/392-2551 
RES: 915/392-3208

507 11th St. Ozona, Texas

PETE W. JACOBY 
Real Estate

RESIDENTIAL-BUSINESS-COMMERCIAL 
RANCH PROPERTIES

PH.392-3059 401HHXCREST

RESIDENTIAL FENCING
Chain Link Cedar Staves 
Board Picket

Split Rail 
; Call

JIM BAGGETT 392-2496

I Thorp’ s LaunDryi
COMPLETE LAUNDRY SERVICE 

LINEN SUPPLY

SHOP TOWEL SERVICE

UNIFORM RENTAL 
ODORLESS DRY CLEANING 

PICK UP AND DELIVERY

4DIAL 392-2484 OZONA, TEXAS

I
I

APARTMENTS 
FOR RENT

Nice Rooms
,  FURNISHEDKitchenettes

^  - n  'u fu r n ish e d1- Bedroom
^  ^  _ FURNISHED2- Bedroom

j  FURNISHED-Bedroom

AU UtiUties Paid 
Phone 392-3437 

[Mbrs. Kenneth Kramer]

CROCKETT HEIGHTS


