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B y  K e n  T o w ery

My reaction to talk of "hate crime" 
legislation has always been to roll my 
eyebrows and think-"Oh well, I guess 
it could be worse."

I had heard all the comments about 
the "Thought Police" taking over the 
country, and it didn't really hit home 
until I read a recent "Focus On The 
Family" newsletter.

You know those guys at "Focus On 
the Family." They are the ones who 
have devoted themselves to hate mon- 
gering philosophies on the importance 
of families, marriage, and love of God 
and each other.

After Matthew Shephard was found 
beaten and tied to a post in Wyoming 
the "Thought Police" went to work.

Because Shephard was a homo­
sexual and had been "picked up" in a 
homosexual bar the horrendous crime 
was labeled a "hate crime" by the 
morning talk shows (also referred to 
as morning news shows) and some lib­
eral columnists.

Even though the police said the 
crime was one of robbery and not "gay 
bashing", the stage had been set by the 
media to get more support for "hate 
crime" legislation.

After the news was out on the mur­
der, Katie Couric on the Today Show, 
addressed this question to the Wyo­
ming governor (I use the word "ques­
tion" loosely—it was meant to be a 
political statement to set the mood for 
attacks from other fronts): "Governor, 
some gay rights activists have said that 
some conservative political organiza­
tions, like the Christian Coalition, the 
Family Research Council, and Focus 
on the Family are contributing to this 
anti-homosexual atmosphere by hav­
ing an ad campaign saying, 'If you are 
a homosexual, you can change your 
orientation.' That prompts people to 
say, 'If I meet someone who's homo­
sexual, I'm going to take action and 
try to convince them and try to harm 
them.' Do you believe that such groups 
are contributing to this climate?"

The next day, the question was 
asked again by Couric to Elizabeth 
Birch of the Human Rights Campaign. 
Birch was asked. "Do you believe this 
campaign-this ad campaign launched 
by some conservative groups—really 
contributed somehow to Matthew 
Shepard's death?"

Birch answered. "I do....These kinds 
of crimes never happen in a vacuum. 
They happen because people's minds 
have been twisted with cruel stereo­
types about gay and lesbian 
people....A nd young Matthew 
Shepard made one mistake, and that's 
that he happened to fall into the path 
of someone that had been fed this 
rhetoric and it came at him full of rage 
and hate."

A few days later columnist Deborah 
Mathis likened conservative Chris­
tians to Nazi Germany and their gas­
sing of millions of Jews.

I don't have room to go into the 
written policy statement of Focus on 
the Family concerning bigotry, preju­
dice and violence. But I assure you 
the barbarians who killed Matthew 
Shephard weren't following the beliefs 
of Focus on the Family or the Chris­

tian Coalition. I doubt these yahoos 
had ever heard of either one of these 
organizations. If they had—maybe 
they wouldn't have been so easily in­
fluenced by evil.

People who called in to NBC to 
complain about the remarks toward 
Focus on the Family were told Katie 
Couric had already talked to the 
founder. Dr. James Dobson, person­
ally and the differences were "worked 
out."

According to Dobson--"That is 
false."

Now I ask you, "If you saw an ad 
that made the point that "it is possible 
for some homosexuals to come out of 
the gay lifestyle and into healthy het­
erosexual relationship," would your 
reaction be- "I'm gonna torture and 
kill the first homosexual I meet?"

So what is the big deal? How come 
those columnists and "news pro­
grams" can't have their freedom of 
speech just like "Focus On The Fam­
ily".

Here's where the "Thought Police" 
go to work.

Who decides who can say what? 
Who decides what is hateful and what 
isn't? Were Katie Couric and Deborah 
Mathis hateful toward "conservative 
Christians?" Are they allowed to make 
slanderous statements and not answer 
for "hate crimes"?

Yes--they are allowed. The 
"Thought Police" wouldn't charge 
Couric and Mathis because what they 
are saying is the current "politically 
correct" thing to say. It's now O.K. to 
"bash Christians".

I will close with one last quote from 
Dr. Dobson. It will give you food for 
thought.

"My major conf'em with the pro­
posed hate crime legislation is that it
will take us on th e  same path as 
Canada. In Canada,*c*chain poiTioris' 
of Scripture can no longer be rend on 
radio or television. If broadcasters 
choose to elaborate on Romans I, for 
example, or other Scriptures that ad­
dress the subject of homosexuality, 
they would be charged with unethical 
practices because officials would in­
terpret the comments as hateful. Fo­
cus can't even cite certain medical in­
formation related to AIDS on a recent 
broadcast because, again, it might 
have offended the homosexual com­
munity. That's where I believe gay and 
lesbian activists in this country want 
to take us."

Freedom of speech is a wonderful 
thing-as long as you belong to the 
correct political activist group.

To end on a lighter note, this funny 
prayer was brought in to me. I hope it 
doesn't offend the "Thought Police".
I don't really want God to smite those 
who don't love me.

May those who love us, love us.
And those that don't love us— 

May God turn their hearts;
And if He doesn't 
turn their hearts.

May He turn their ankles 
So we'll know them 

By their limping.

If any reader ever had a doubt that 
George W Bush intends to run for the 
presidency, forget it. He does. In fact, 
he's running now, in an oblique sort 
of way.

Our governor has just returned from 
the obligatory trip to Israel, where he 
generally touched all the right bases, 
and generally comported himself in a 
manner that suggests someone knowl­
edgeable in such matters had given 
him some good advice. We suspect his 
father.

The elder Bush, our former presi­
dent, is well aware of the pitfalls in­
volved in Middle East politics. One 
misstep and Israeli's lobby in this 
country can, and will, raise a hue and 
cry that frightens even the most reso­
lute politician. In fact, it doesn't even 
have to be a misstep. It can be some­
thing as small as standing up for 
America's interests in the region.

As an example. The Israelis, for 
their own reasons, wanted desperately 
to beconie involved in the war against 
Iraq. Bush managed to keep them at 
bay during the war, knowing their in­
volvement would cause the whole al­
lied effort to unravel. Nothing would 
have pleased the Israelis more, hav­
ing the entire effort come down to a 
war with the U.S. and Israel on one 
side, and Saddam on the other, with

the Arab states split asunder. That 
would have helped Israel's long term 
goals, but it would have played havoc 
with America's.

So in return for abiding by 
America's wishes in staying out of 
the war, the Israelis demanded a $10 
billion grant, on top of the billions 
they get in the normal, never ending 
course of U.S. aid. Well, actually it 
was a $10 billion interest free loan, to 
be paid back someday, perhaps with 
other money from our taxpayers. 
(Former Senator Cranston of Califor­
nia was responsible for the law that 
says the amount of foreign aid to Is­
rael can never fall below a level that 
would pay the interest on any loan to 
Israel.) So it amounts to the same 
thing.

President Bush, rightly in our opin­
ion, was hesitant. He wanted them to 
promise they wouldn't use the money 
to build more settlements on Palestin­
ian land. Tliat caused great conster­
nation among the Israelis and their 
lobby in this country. Mr. Netanyahu, 
who was Israel's ambassador to this 
country, went on American tv to claim 
that Israel was "owed" the money.

The president came out of that war 
with the national press singing his 
praises, and his "approval" rating 
among the American public at about

90 percent. But as the flap over the 
money escalated. Bush's press turned 
sour, and you know the rest of the 
story.

At any rate, there arc two natiiis that 
are anathema in Israel, George Bush 
and James Baker, who was Bush's sec­
retary of state. We doubt that either 
could successfully operate a retail 
business in Israel. Their only custom­
ers would be Palestinians, and they 
don't have much money.

Our current governor has something 
to answer for, as well. Back in 1993, 
before he opened his campaign for 
governor, he was questioned about his 
religious views in what the press de­
scribes as a "formal" conference in 
Dallas. He is reported to have said that 
he believes the personal acceptance of 
Jesus Christ as Savior is necessary for 
entry into Heaven. He also says it is 
not up to him as governor -  it is up to 
God - to decide who gets in. That is 
the position taken by many Christian 
denominations.

While the comment created no great 
stir at the lime, it continues to dog the 
governor. The A nti-D efam ation 
League, a New York based Jewish 
group founded in 1913 to ferret out 
anti-semitism, or anything the ADL 
can construe as anti-semitism, wher­
ever it rears its head, took immediate

Register now for local SPC classes
Spring registration for college 

courses in Floydada offered by South 
Plains College is now underway at the 
Floydada Chamber of Commerce, ac­
cording to Angie Lipham, chamber 
manager.

Interested persons can sign up for 
classes from 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
weekdays at the chamber office, lo­
cated in the Floydada City Hall at 114 
W. Virginia.

Later registration is 5:30 p.m. to 
6:30 p.m. January 6th.

Classes begin January 19th at Floy­
dada High School.

SPC will offer courses in Compo­
sition I, meeting 6:00 to 9:00 p.m. 
Mondays and taught by Sally Good; 
History of the United States to 1876, 
6:00 to 9:00 p.m. Tuesdays, Blake 
Dunnavent; College Algebra, 6:00 to 
9:00 p.m. Wednesdays, Martha Jones;

Lockney Scouts to pick 
up food this Saturday

LOCKNEY-The Lockney Boy 
Scouts will continue their annual 
"Scouting For Food" drive this Satur- 
"da>(to bfenefit the Lockney chapter of 
the Salvation Army.

Scouts will return to Lockney 
neighborhoods Saturday, December 
12, at 9:30 a.m., to pick up the plastic 
bags which had been left on resident's 
front doorsteps last Saturday.

The Scouts are asking residents to 
please have the bags filled with 
canned goods and nonperishable 

/oo(^i and placed back on their porch, 
Saturday, morning Dec. 13th. If you 
have lost your bag from last week the 
Scouts ask that you fill any bag full 
of food. They will be glad to pick up 
whatever is left for them.

Everything collected goes to the 
Lockney Salvation Army.

and American Government, Organi­
zation, 6:00 to 9:00 p.m. Thursdays, 
staff.

High school seniors may apply for 
early admission through their high 
school principal, noted Jim Walker, 
dean of continuing and distance edu­
cation at SPC. Other persons must be 
a high school graduate or possess a 
GED certificate.

In order to enroll, students must 
provide a completed application for 
admission, official transcript from 
high school or college and proof of 
Texas residency for the previous 12 
month period. A copy of a valid Texas 
driver's license is usually sufficient.

Persons who have not obtained 
three hours of college credit prior to 
September 1, 1989, need to take the 
Texas Academic Skills Program test. 
For more information, contact the 
Floydada Chamber of Commerce Of­
fice at 806-983-3434 or the SPC Di­
vision of Continuing and Distance 
Education at 806-894-9611, ext. 2341

notice. Mr. Abraham Foxman, the 
group's executive director, says he 
discussed the matter with Bush, and 
is now "satisfied" with where our gov- 
emor "is coming from". In a recent 
interview, Foxman said he now ex­
pects the governor to "clarify" his re­
marks shortly. Bush, after his trip to 
Israel, seems to take the position that 
the matter is closed, as it should be.

In the meantime, the issue has been 
raised on the national level, now that 
Bush may stand for the presidency. He 
can get by with comments like that in 
most of Texas, even be rewarded for 
them. But on the national scene it's a 
different matter. The New York Times 
has taken note, and others will follow. 
The Austin American-Statesman re­
cently ran an editorial cartoon of the 
governor with his foot in his mouth. 
News stories, and "think pieces" con­
tinue to refer to the quote, albeit in a 
somewhat passing manner.

The nominating process in Califor­
nia and New York will be heavily in­
fluenced by Israeli issues. Much of the 
national media, including the enter­
tainment industry, will be heavily in­
fluenced by Israeli issues. Any politi­
cian who fails to respond properly to 
Israeli issues will incur the wrath of 
the Times' Bill Safire, and a host of 
editorial writers. So Mr. Bush can ex­
pect to see the quote played in the 
months ahead, the closer he gets to 
nominating time.

Anyone who has ever had any in­
volvement in national politics will rec­
ognize the tactic immediately. It in­
volves an effort at intimidation, and 
is effective on those who will succumb 
to intimidation. At this moment it ap­
pears our governor won't be intimi­
dated, at least on this issue. We'll see 
how he stands up to criticism on other 
issues as well. Still, one will have to 
say, any politician who doesn't tuck 
tail and run from the ADL is showing 
a great deal of courage. And courage, 
in politics, is always good sense.
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Give The Gift They Will Thank 
You For All Year Long

h:

For the price of a one year 
gift subscription your present 
will be delivered every week!

In County Subscription: $16.00 
Out of County: $18.00 

Out of State: $19.00

You won't be afraid of
El Nino if you insure 

with
GOEN & GOEN

102 E. California, Floydada 983-3524

CROP - FARM - AUTO - HOME - LIFE - BUSINESS

COURTROOM ACTIVITIES
In County Court, Dec. 4, 1998: 
Cecil Clark was charged with Theft 

of $20.00 or more, less than $500.00;
Salvador Cavazos, 32. of Floyd 

County, was charged with Theft of 
$20.00 or more, less than $500.00;

David L. Main, was charged with 
Theft of $20.00 or more, less than
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$500.00;
Linda Ratliff, 40, of Floyd County, 

was charged with three cases of Theft 
of $20.00 or more, less than $500.(X);

LOCKNEY  
^POLICE REPORT

LOCKNEY-Lowe's Pay-N-Savc in 
Lockney reported receiving a forged 
check on November 23rd. The suspect 
made restitution and no charges were 
filed.

Local school officials reported a 
school bus was damaged during a ba.s- 
kelball giuric. Inve.sligalion continues.

A resident of the Providence com­
munity reported his vehicle was bur­
glarized while he was parked near the 
hospital on November 25. Tools and 
an air compres.sor were taken. Inves­
tigation continues.

On November 29 Lockney Police 
slopped a yellow '85 Chevrolet on 
Hwy. 378 North of U.S. 70. 
Guadalupe P, Martinez, 35, of Floy­
dada, was driving on the wrong side 
of the road. He was arrested for DWI.

December 5, a 16 year old Lockney 
youth was detained for P.I. A citation 
was i.ssued and he was turned over to 
the P.A.C. in Floydada.

A nnouncing great new rate plans ■ More minutes & features included i Free conference calling, call waiting, call forwarding 
Free voice mail i Amarillo, Wichita Falls, Lawton and Oklahoma City included in expanded home area

The truth is we invented Fl’lM (Free First Incoming Minute). Statistically, more than 70 percent 
of cellular calls are less than 60 seconds. So why not make them free? This y/sy all those quick 
calls from home to find out when you will home are f i ^  And if someone mistakenly calls your

number, you won't pay for that either. But, there's more to 
Cellular One than FFIM, our new rate plans not only gve you 
lots of great free features, but more minutes for less money.
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Floydada Band shares 
Christmas songs Sunday

FLOYDADA--This Sunday after­
noon, December 13, at 2;30, the Floy­
dada Schools will present their annual 
Christmas Band concert. Participating 
in the concert will be the Sixth Grade 
Beginner Band, the Junior High Sev­
enth and Eighth Grade Band, Junior 
High UIL Band, and the High School 
Band. The Bands are under the direc­
tion of Band Directors John M. Odom 
and Nelson Dotson.

The Sixth Grade Band will perform 
three selections which include 
Beethovan's Ninth, Parade of the Bells 
and Needle in the Haystack^ This year 
the Junior High Bands have been 
separated into two groups. One Band 
is made up of students who will par­
ticipate in UIL Concert contest in the 
spring. The Seventh and Eighth Grade

Band will play Christmas Chimes, The 
Little Drummer Boy and Jingle Bells 
Around the World, and the UIL Band 
will perform Winter Wonderland, Si­
lent Night and Jingle Bell Rock.

The High School Band will close 
the concert with four selections of 
their own. The selection. Kitchen Fi­
esta, will feature three celebrity solo­
ists for the Band. The Band will then 
feature a Dixieland combo with the 
song Santa Does Dixie. The High 
School Band will close the concert 
with Sleigh Ride and/t Christmas Fi­
nale.

There is no admission charge for the 
concert and everyone in the commu­
nity is invited to attend an afternoon 
of fun music and entertainment.

Sen Shapiro to introduce 
drug testing bill for schools

If a bill being introduced in the State 
Senate, by Senator Florence Shapiro, 
is approved by the Texas legislature 
drug testing in schools may become 
commonplace.

Senate Bill No. 42 will be intro­
duced into the next legislative session, 
January 12, 1999, by Sen. Shapiro of 
District 8 in Plano.

The bill will authorize school dis­
tricts to offer volunteer drug testing 
programs.

The bill reads in part:
"A school district may provide a 

drug testing program under which a 
student, at the request of the student's 
parent, is randomly tested for the pres­
ence in the student's body of marijuana 
or a controlled substance.

"A school district that provides a 
program under this section shall 
charge the parent of a student partici­
pating in the program a fee to cover 
the costs of administering the program 
and conducting the drug tests.

"Results of the drug test conducted 
under this section are confidential and, 
unless required by court order, may 
be disclosed only to the student and 
the student's parent. A school district 
providing a program under this sec­
tion shall ensure that the student's par­
ent receives test results directly from 
the lab analyzing the test or from an 
appropriate person who is not em­
ployed by the district."

If enacted this Act would begin with 
the 1999-2000 school year.

Thornberry nam ed to 
House Budget Committee

U.S. Rep. Mac Thornberry (TX-13) 
has named to the House Budget Com­
mittee for the upcoming 106th Con­
gress.

The House Budget Committee is 
responsible for overseeing the federal 
budget and the process by which the 
federal budget is adopted. Chaired by 
Congressman John Kasich of Ohio, 
the Budget Committee played a ma­
jor role in drafting the Balanced Bud­
get Act of 1997, which eliminated the 
Nation's budget deficit for the first 
time in nearly 30 years.

"As someone who ran on the plat­
form of balancing our Nation's bud­
get, " Thornberry said, " I think it’s a 
real honor to serve on the committee 
that actually helped bring it about. But 
it's also an opportunity. For even 
though we have a budget surplus for 
the first time since 1969, the fact re­
mains that Washington is still spend­
ing too much of our money, and is still 
taking too much money out of our 
pockets in the form of high taxes.

"The Budget Committee is on the 
front line of cutting taxes and scaling 
back the size and scope of govern­
ment. For a fiscal conservative like 
myself, it’s an ideal place to serve and 
make sure we don’t spend the surplus 
on new federal programs or bigger 
government. But beyond that, it’s also 
a ideal place to continue the larger 
debate our country needs to have 
about the size and role of government 
in our society."

Thornberry is the author of two key 
bills geared toward cutting taxes and 
letting people keep more of what they 
earn. The first bill would repeal the

Thanks for reading The Hesperian-Beacon!

Nielson's, The Place 
For Great Buffets!

FREE 
Ice Cream 

with any meal!

Family Style 
Atmosphere!

N E W ! T u e s d a y  N o o n  B u ffe t !

*  Tuesday Noon - Potato, Soup, Salad Bar!
*  Friday N o o n  ■ Fajitas a n d  Enchiladas!
*  Friday N ig h t - Fish Fry  - A ll Y o u  Can Eatl
*  S un d a y N o o n  Buffet - Delicious!
*  Free Ice Cream !

Lockney Band prepares 
for Christmas concert

LO CK N EY -Thc Lockney 6th 
grade, junior high and high school 
bands will hold their Christmas con­
cert Tuesday, December 15 at 7:00 
p.m. in the Longhorn Gym.

Band Director Keith Riley invites 
everyone to come and enjoy the 
Christmas music.

The Sixth Grade Band will play 
Deck The Halls, All Through the 
Night, Auld luing Syne and Jolly Old

St. Nick.
Members of the Junior High 7 & 8 

Grade Band will play Silver Bells, Let 
It Snow, Let It Snow, Let It Snow, A 
Childhood Hymn, and The 
STORMQuest!

The High School Band will per­
form It's Beginning to Look A Lot Like 
Christmas, Silent Night, Truefire! and 
Dvorak's 9th Symphony (The New 
World Symphony).

Commissioners approve 
new J.P. in special meeting

By Darwin Robinson
The Floyd County Commissioners 

convened Friday morning, December 
4th, at 9:00 a.m. for a special meeting 
approving the appointment of Carolyn 
Jackson as the Justice of Peace of 
Floyd County until the end of the year.

Due to the death of Dorothy 
Stansell, the appointment was neces­
sary to finish out this year with a Jus­
tice of Peace for the county.

Judge William D. Hardin made the 
motion and it was seconded by Com­
missioner Lennie Gilroy. Commis­
sioners Jon Jones and George Taylor 
voted in favor of the motion making 
it unanimous. Commissioner Ray Nell 
Bearden was absent due to being out 
of town.

The meeting was adjourned and 
Carolyn Jackson was sworn into of­
fice about an hour later.

SHARE THE WARMTH~For her 4-H Clothing Project, Bonnie Dunlap, 
has chosen to collect donated coats which will be passed out to those in 
need. All sizes of coats are being collected. They can be dropped of at the 
4-H Extension Office. Please have the coats in soon so the coats can be 
distributed by Christmas. Helping Bonnie with the project are: (back, 1- 
r) Molly Long, Bonnie Dunlap, Melissa Dunlap; (front, 1-r) Allison Griggs, 
and Katie Beth Crossland. Staff Photo

Save time and money 
Shop for x-mas in your hometown^

inheritance and gift tax. The second 
measure, called The Better Bracket 
Act, would lower taxes on millions of 
middle income Americans by lower­
ing their income tax rate from 28 to 
15 percent. His efforts to cut taxes and 
reduce government spending have 
eafhed him recognition from a wide 
range of pro-taxpayer, small govern­
ment organizations, including Ameri­
cans for Tax Reform, Citizens for a 
Sound Economy, and the National 
Taxpayers Union, which last year 
ranked him 37th out of 435 House 
members for his work in this area.

He said his priorities on the Budget 
Committee will continue to be geared 
around lower taxes and smaller, 
smarter government, but will also in­
clude reforming the congressional 
budget process, itself. "We’ve got to 
quit putting members of Congress in 
a position of having to vote on huge 
spending bills that seem to include just 
about everything under the sun,’’ he 
stated, making specific reference to 
the 40 pound, 4,(MX) page omnibus 
appropriations bill which was signed 
into law last month.

"Whether that involves going to a 
two year budget cycle or some other 
plan that makes things less unwieldy. 
I’m not sure. But it’s something we’ve 
got to look at, and something I plan to 
push for on the Committee next year."

Thornberry gave up his seat on the 
joint Economic Committee for his 
appointment to the House Budget 
Committee. His other assignments on 
the National Security Committee and 
the Committee on Resources remain 
unchanged.

Fire Department to cook 
your Christmas turkey

For a $5.00 donation, the F loydada Fire D epartm ent will 
smoke your Christm as ham , turkey, or other other choice 
cut o f m eat on M onday, D ecem ber 21 or Tuesday, Dec. 
22.

Call Floydada City Hall, 983-2834 to reserve a spot.

Open House
1 - 5  p . m .

J r i d a y ,  D e c e m b e r  1 1

R efreshm ents w ill  be served

Floyd County 
H istorical Museum

105 East Missouri, Floydada

Thank you for being a 10W6'S customer, and 
for letting us into your family for the holidays.

10,000 FAMILIES
received free turkey dinners for the holidays 

during our Great Gobble Giveaway.

From the lOWB'S family to yours, we 
wish you Happy Holidays!

\ i c / s o n  \
3114 K. Iloiistnii l-lo\d.i(l.i MS3-34M
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Floydada Senior Citizen News

CANCER BOARD MEMBERS—Board members of the American Cancer Society stayed busy at the success­
ful fund Christmas Brunch in the Heflin home December 5th. Helping serve were (I -r) Laura llirner. Sue 
Daniel, Brenda Heflin, Denise Holcombe and Martha Lotspeich.

By Margarette Word
FLOYDADA—The center is open 

Monday through Friday. If you are 60 
years or older this center if for you. If 
you plan on eating lunch, please call 
983-2032 by 10 a.m.

Deeota Odam went to Hale Center 
where her daughter Virginia Waits had 
12 family members in for Thanksgiv­
ing Holiday dinner.

Last Saturday evening at the Uni­
versity Medical Center the Caprock 
Girl Scout Council presented the 
"Women of Distinction" scholarship 
banquet. From our community Billie 

■Jordan was honored along with nine 
other area ladies. They have made a 
direct and powerful impact on the 
lives of others, particularly Girl 
Scouts, through their support of and 
belief in Girl Scouting. Those attend­
ing to support Mrs. Jordan were her 
family Dr. Jack Jordan, daughter 
Annette and her husband. Dr. Tommy 
Bonds and their children, Nikki and

Jordan from Muleshoe and Billie's sis­
ter, Pat Ferguson from Lawrenceville, 
Georgia.

Friends who u.se to live in Floydada, 
but now live in Lubbock, were 
Mildred Wylie and Peggy Dyess. 
Friends from Floydada were Ann 
C arthel, M artha Farris. Jane 
McCulley, Doris McLain, Rev. lone 
and Vic Sedinger, Judge Bill and 
Roberta Hardin, Nell McClung, Louis 
and Janice Lloyd, Dr. Charles Craig, 
Alice Baker, Jane Bean, Edell and 
Lovene Moore, Amy Hollums, L.B 
and Verna Lynn Stewart, Nathan and 
Kathy Mulder, Margie Fowler, Jo 
Wester, Elie Anderson, Geneile Evans, 
Carol Reese and Jim and Margarette 
Word.

Donations to help us keep the cen­
ter open are still coming in and we 
truly appreciate your concern and the 
help you are giving the center. Mak­
ing donations since I last reported was 
Guy Ga-Tison. Those making memo-

A Few Heart-Hitting Facts
W om en

In every year since 1984, diseases of the 
heart and blood vessels have claimed the 
lives of more females than males, and 
the gap continues to widen. Heart 
di.sea.se and stroke kill more than half a 
million women in the United States 
every year — more than the next 16 
causes of death combined, and almost 
twice as many as all forms of cancer, 
including breast cancer.

Black women are at even greater risk. 
The death rate from coronary heart 
disease is more than 35 percent higher 
for black women than for white women, 
and the death rate from stroke is 7 I 
percent higher.

High BI(hh1 Pressure

The American Heart Association says 
that 35 percent of Americans w ho have 
high blood pressure don't know they 
hav^ it.

Sm oking

rial donations were: in memory of 
Red Mooney by Mr. & Mrs. Wayne 
Collins; in memory of Myrtis Rainer 
were Delmas & Pauline McCormick 
and Mac «& Charlene Smitherman; m 
memory of Neil Langely was Delmas 
& Pauline McCormick; in memory of 
Gladys Jones was Bernice Stapleton; 
in memory of Georgia Edwards was 
Mr. &L Mrs. James Malett; in memory 
of Jack Jarrett were Jo Davis, "Dub" 
& Margaret Daniel, Ernestine Gilley, 
Bcmice Stapleton, John & Geneva 
Cockrell, Margaret Saul, Roger* Bo 
Poage, Dr. Jack & Billie Jordan, 
Crawford Sandefur, Bill & Norma 
Feuerbacher and Deeota Odam.

"Thought For The Week"
Tolerance comes with age; I see no 

fault committed that I myself could not 
have committed at some time or other. 
— Goethe

MENU
December 14-18

Monday: Brisket, scallop potatoes, 
fried okra, pickles, wheat roll, apricot 
cobbler

Tuesday: Chicken and Dumplings, 
baby limas, carrots, coleslaw, corn- 
bread, oranges and bananas

Wednesday: Burritos Verdes, lime 
rice, south Texas squash casserole, 
lettuce and tomato salad, Chilean

FNB FLOYDADA ARTISTS OF THE MONTH-Joel Tardy and Lonnie Mason will display their artwork for
the month of December.

Health and 
Rehab

By Rebecca Rodriquez A.D.
Hello to everyone from Lockney 

Health and Rehabilitation Center. Is 
everyone ready for Christmas, yet? 
We are working really hard on it right 
now!!

We would like to invite all of our 
residents' families to our home to cel­
ebrate Christmas for our residents on 
Saturday, December 12th, 10:(X)a.m. 
"Grammy and Pop" will be our guest 
entertainers for the morning. Family 
members are asked to bring finger 
foods for the party. We hope to sec 
you here!

/  KNOW THAT HE LOVES ME
All the stars are twinkling 

in the sky above.
The moon softly beaming 

with rays of His love.
Though shadows are creeping, 

the night holds no fear 
For angels surround me 

thus God is so near.
I bow down before Him 

as I kneel in prayer,
I give Him my burdens, 
each heartache and care.
I know I can trust Him, 

thus, with faith complete,
I know that in time, all 
my needs He will meet.

I know that He loves me, 
that heavenly One.

He proved it that day that 
he gave His only Son.

And so as my eyes clo.se 
in sweet, peaceful sleep.

The angels will guard me 
and His watch He'll keep.

By Mary E. Herrington
This poem is dedicated in the 

memory of our loved one: James Hill.

a m  C a r e  C e n t e r

/UDll-t

According to the American Heart 
Association, the prevalence of high 

^  blo(pd pressure increases with age. is 
gre,î (̂ J?Lli bkJCj>s^iq|ur wh|l«i*,i«)d in--̂

Is^s-cducpted  ̂
than m more-educated people.,fi Hiiv; '

Smokers have more than twice the risk 
of heart attack as nonsmokers, and salad dressing, empanadas de calabaza 
smokers have a greater risk of stroke, ITiursday: Beef Pot Pie, Italian veg- 
says the American Heart Association, etable, tossed salad/Italian, garlic 
Chronic exposure to environmental bread, banana pudding 
tobacco smoke (passive smoking) Friday: Oven Fried Chicken, corn, 
increases the risk of heart disease and spinach, tossed salad/French, hot roll. 
^oke in nonsmokers.________________frosted spice cake_____________

fHoUday Sale
ZOfjhoff
All Christmas 

Decorative Items 
Candle Rings 

Garland 
s Wreaths

Centerpieces 
Greenery

By Patricia Hill A.D.
Merry Christmas Floyd County 

from the resident's and staff at the 
Floydada Rehab and Care Center.

FRCC would like to thank Mr. 
Ballou and the young men from the 
PAC Center. They came out last week 
and helped put up the Christmas trees 
and all the decorations. That was a big 
help. Thanks so much from all of us.

Residents and Family have their 
Christmas party Tuesday, December 
15th. at 6:30 p.m. If you have any 
questions please call the facility at 
983-3704.

December 17th is the resident's 
Birthday party at 3:00 p.m. Come out 
and enjoy cake and punch. Residents 
celebrating birthday's are, Minnie 
Gowens, December 17th; Mary War­
ren, December 19th and Wanda With­

ers, December 20th. Employee'^ 
birthday's are; Elvira Rodriquez, De­
cember 4; Jane Martinez, December 
5th; Elizabeth Caballero, December 
18th; Donna Thiebaud, December 
7th; KiKi Wilcox, December 23rd and 
Patricia Hill, December 30lh.

Resident of the Month is Pauline 
Benefield. Employee of the month is 
Dorothy Kerr.

You can still order your pies for the 
holidays from Dorothy, until Christ­
mas. December 16th is the last day to 
buy your raffle tickets for the big 
screen TV.

That's all for now, God Bless until 
next time.

Thought for the Week:
Common-Looking people are the 

best in the world; that is the reason 
the Lord makes so many of them.

Have a ^reat Week!

Ii>'t

&  S ic c e s s o r ie s
100 East California, Floydada 983-5312

J

J O I N
F I R M .

American Heart | 
Association
f$Qhting H M zr OiMNiM 

ir>d Sfrokr

E X E R C I S E .

Diamond Studs 
V uct W *  
%CT *159- 
%CT *499- 
iCT *1249“

Drop
M.CT *99^
y4cr *249- 
%CT ♦998**

6 mm Pearl Studs j

•39“

Thin 
Tab 100

Thermogenic Fat Burner 
12 Pure Herbs & 

Chromium Plcollnote 
•Reduce Craving for Fats & Sweets 

•Alleviate Hunger •Increase Stamina 
•Increase Mental Energy

Powerful Energy Booster 
SEE RESULTS IN 10 DAYS

^resfi & (Permanent fArrangement 
(Poinsettias - Jresh (Hotty 
(Dept 56 Snow VUCage 

Precious (^foment - (penton 
SarafCs Mtic Snowmen 

%ennetfi Wyatt Prints & JeweCi 
(Kenneth Wyatt newest Boo/^- 

"Christ & the CowBoy"

Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts
112 W. Poplar, Lockney 652-2385

.78«t. Saguotto 
Diamond 

Anidvoraary 
■and

•999

w . star Cut Bluo Topaz Only 
at ThacKar Jewelry 

Official State Stone 
of Texas

^  Pendants from SS9 
Earrings from S99

Ladles Dlwnond 
Ring l.lS ct. 
SALI PRICE%s»

T H A C K E R  0  
d E W E L R V

14K Qold Panda 
Coin Ring

4 7 4
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f l o y d  C o u ifty

L ife s ty le s

1950 Study Club
hears "Bridging 
the Gap " program

SANTA AND HIS HELPERS— Santa Claus (O a r  Schacht) was helped 
by his elves (l>r) Spencer Schacht and Taylor Sue at Lockney's Holiday 
Affair December 3. Staff Photo

Whirlwind Sams

By Carol Reese
The lovely decorated home of Sue 

Moore was the gathering place for the 
December 1st meeting of the 1950 
Study Club. Vice-President Billie Jor­
dan welcomed members and guests. 
Doris McLain, program hostess, in­
troduced Julie Ellison, who presented 
the guest speakers, Kenzie and Tessa 
Stapp.

Tliey shared with the club their pre­
sentation "Bridging the Gap - Volun­
teer Services for the Elderly." This is 
an ongoing program started two years 
ago by a group of Lockney High 
School students, with Mrs. Ellison 
serving as their advisor.

They do their volunteer work at the 
Lockney Care Center. Kenzie and 
Tessa have presented their program, 
about the group's services, to numer­
ous audiences and have won local.

regional, state and national recogni­
tion. This is a very dedicated group 
of young people who share their time 
and talents - bridging the gap.

Club members brought gifts of lo­
tion and body powder to be distrib­
uted to the residents of local nursing 
homes. After a brief business meet­
ing, refreshments were served by Sue 
Moore and Shirley Morton. A time of 
visitation and fellowship was enjoyed 
by the three guests and members: Ellie 
Anderson, Joy Assiter, Nancy Bishop, 
Geneile Evans, Margie Fowler, Hope 
Gaussoin, Wanda Hickerson, Amy 
Hollum s, B illie Jordan, M artha 
Lotspeich, Jane McCulley, Marge 
McElyea, Doris McLain. Lovene 
Moore, Sue Moore, Shirley Morton, 
Carol Reese, Roberta Russell, Joy 
Smitherman and Nettie Ruth Whittle.

J IL L  W ARREN

Warren to display art

By Darlynn H ambright
FLOYDADA-Tne Chapter Christ­

mas party for the Whirlwind Sams 
was celebrated at the Plains Baptist 
Assembly, Saturday, December 5, 
1998.

Welcome and introduction of guests 
was given by president, Randy 
Hollums. Paul Westbrook led the in­
vocation.

The decorating committee, Carol 
Reese, Norma Feuerbacher, and Jo 
Payne was recognized as well as the 
staff at the encampment for the beau­
tiful table arrangements and other 
decorations.

Members celebrating birthdays this 
month are Charlene Norrell. Don 
Chesshir, Bob Kendrick. Harold 
Norrell and Hollis Payne.

Those commemorating anniversa­
ries are Claude and Frances 
Weathersbee, John and Christine 
Lyles, Harold and Carol Reese and 
Robert and Betty McPherson. Songs 
were sung in their honor, led by Boone 
Adams.

The appetizing meal, which was 
catered by the Assembly staff was 
brisket, potato casserole, broccoli, 
vegetable salad, fruit salad soup or 
chowder; hot rolls, cherry or apple 
cobbler, tea and coffee. It was served 
buffet style.

Randy Hollums expressed his ap­
preciation to the other club officers 
and members for the cooperation and 
outstanding Job each contributed for 
a successful year of travel and 
campouts.

The program for the evening was 
opened by Randy reading a Christmas 
poem. Norma Feuerbacher rendered 
her version of "Twas the Night Be­
fore Christmas at the Wayne Russell 
RV Park. This was humorous for ev­
eryone. Teresa Hollums concluded the 
program with a guessing game asso­
ciated with Christmas Carols. Dartha 
Westbrook, pianist; Mac McElyea, 
guitarist and Audrey Temple led the 
group in singing carols.

Claude Weathersbee installed the 
following slate of officers for 1999; 
Jerry Livingston, president; Harold 
Norrell. 2nd vice-president; Betty 
Miller, secretary; Glenda Livingston, 
treasurer; G ordon H am bright, 
wagonmaster. Darrell Mayo, vice 
president, was not present.

Yearbooks were distributed by Jerry 
and Glenda Livingston.

Marge McElyea presented past 
president, Randy and Teresa Hollums 
with a beautiful hand quilted friend­
ship quilt.

Randy and Teresa Hollums gave 
each couple a canvas travel bag per­

sonalized with a smilely face and 
happy trails.

Jerry projected the Sams group 
would have another fine year of ac­
tivities and campouts. He also an­
nounced the Ladies Coffee, Thursday, 
December 10th at 9:30 a.m. at Pizza 
Gold.

Present for the Christmas party 
were: Boone and Ruth Adams, Don 
and Sue Chesshir, Bill and Norma 
Feuerbacker, J.W. and Betty 
G ilbreath, Gordon and Darlynn 
Hambright, Randy and Teresa 
Hollums, Jerry and Glenda 
Livingston, John and Christine Lyles, 
Mac and Marge McElyea, George and 
Betty Miller, Harold and Charlene 
Norrell, Dr. Keith and June Patzer, 
Hoilis and Jo Payne, Wayne and 
Roberta Russell, Harold and Audrey 
Temple, Fred and Yvonne Thaxton, 
Herb and Esther Wallace and Paul and 
Dartha Westbrook. Associate mem­
bers present were Claude and Frances 
Weathersbee and guests were in­
cluded, Phil and Marian Almen of 
Plainview, T.W. and Hope Gaussoin 
and Paul and Brenda Parker all of 
Floydada.

The group sang "Happy Trails" led 
by Boone Adams to close the peirty.

Lockney Senior Citizen News
By Gladys Ragle 
LOCKNEY-I think by the time you 

read this we will have experienced 
some cold weather - enough to make 
us believe that winter is coming.

Did you see the beautiful rainbow 
last Thursday afternoon about 5:30, 
after we had the good shower. I 
thought of God's promise in Genesis 
10:13-15 that he would not destroy the 
world by flood again.

Lockney lost another good citizen 
and the Senior Center a good mem­
ber with the death of James Hill. Our 
condolences go out to his family and 
those who were closely associated 
with him.

Johnnie Kellison was admitted to 
Mangold Memorial last Saturday. We 
hope she will soon be out and around 

Eddie Douglas remains in Lubbock 
Methodist Hospital. She had some 
additional surgery on Sunday and we 
hope this will help her recovery. We 
wish her well.

SHAKLEE
»83-S246

"Weekly Words of Wisdom"
We lose love, not because of big 

mistakes but because of little neglects.
MENU

December 14-18
Monday - Salmon patties, veg­

etables, salad, dessert 
Tuesday - Meat loaf, vegetables, 

salad, dessert
Wednesday - Chicken fried steak, 

vegetables, salad, dessert 
Thursday - Chicken strips, veg­

etables, salad, dessert 
Friday - Roast beef, vegetables, 

salad, dessert.

FLOYDADA--Amcrican State 
Bank in Floydada would like to in­
vite the public to a showing of origi­
nal oil paintings and prints by local 
artist, Jill Warren, on Thursday, De­
cember 17.

Warren has recently printed six of 
her favorite paintings. She is glad to 
offer these limited edition, signed 
prints for those who enjoy her work. 
All of the prints represent what has 
become hallmarks of her work: atten­
tion to light and detail.

Warren's paintings of familiar sub­
jects elicit responses like: "Oh, my 
grandmother had a tablecloth like 
that." or "I've seen that very scene 
before!" At art shows, people often 
express gratitude for her realistic style 
to which they can relate.

Warren has been painting profes­
sionally for about fifteen years. Her 
paintings can be found in private and 
corporate collections in the U.S. and 
abroad. She is a member of the 
Women Artists of the West and Oil 
Painters of America.

Have a Great Day!

Th is  is the third date 
you’ve broken because 

you’ve been abducted by 
aliens, Marcia. Maybe you 

should move to another 
neighborhood.”

Remember i^our Sweetheai 
with fre s h w a te r  P e a r ls

...or select her gift 
from our new shipment of 

S te r lin g  S ilv e r  fe w e lry

...or our exciting selection of 
C lo th in g

the yellow l^rick tZoad
Free Gift Wrapping 
Visa - MasterCard

117 S. Main, Lockney 
652-2824

Haleys WLnter Clearance Sale
o

• . ■

' S ’:

• - »

Need A Gift Idea?
How about a subscription 

to this newspaper?

In County............$ 16.00
(Also Includes: Hale, Briscoe, 
Swisher, Motley and Crosby)

Out of Counties ....$ 18.00 
Out of State.........$19.00

(Sr. Citizens discount •••• $1.00)

n r o tn t f f  t/tf, (ranter,

Duke's Dodads. ^/fam
^ ( ’f ir / ic r i  r /p /u ,

(j/trU h tK h i (S e r te r  (§t^e(frf4,

(rjfftt(//r..i\ ntff/fia ttu/irfi. ntorel

721 W. Ollie, Floydada 
(beside Ray Lee Equipment)

1UE8. - THUR8.

9 : 0 0  T U  0 : 0 0

Men's and Boy's Short Sleeve 
KNIT SHIRTS 

Reg. 75.00 to 16.00
NOW 34.99 to 9.99

$4.99
MEN'S SWEATERS 

(not a misprint)
A Real Super Bargain

Long Sleeve Men's 
SPORTSHIRTS 

All Cotton & Permanent Press 
Plaids. Stripes, & Solids

25 to 50% off

All BOY’S SHIRTS
Long Sleeve 
Short Sleeve 

Pullovers 
Button Fronts 

Western
ALL REDUCED

25% to 50%

Men's Wrinkle-Free 
COTTON FLEX PANTS 
Reg. 43.00 NOW 29.99 

Khaki, Camel, Loden, 
Navy, Black and Stone

WRANGLER RIATA
Khaki Only

29.99
HAGGAR Brushed 

Cotton PANT
19.99

MEMBERS ONLY 
MICROFIBER 

JACKETS
Sizes Small to XXL 

Tails Available
ALL 25% off

Men's
WRANGLER 13 MWZ 

19.98 everyday 
38 & 40 lengths 
slightly higher 

PREWASH BLACK 
13 MWZ
24.99

PREWASH 31 MWZ 
Relaxed Fit

24.99

All Athletic Gear from NIKE and ADIDAS
20% off

Lots of Shoes Reduced Also

‘4.

Large Group of Men's 
Long Sleeve DRESS SHIRTS 

19.99 and Less 
Values to $40.00
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country Horns vie at Friona Tourney

;o lf ;
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Ttry - 
"football -

basketball - track - t e n n i^

LHS A ll-South  Plains

THAD LUSK 
Senior

1st Team Offense 
Tight End 

1st Team Defense 
Linebacker 

Honorable Mention 
All South Plains 

Tight End & Linebacker

a \C,
f i —! 'Ml

JUSTIN McGUlRE 
Junior

Unanimous Selection 
1st Team Offense 

Running Back 
1st Team Defense 
Defensive Back 
All South Plains 
Defensive Back

DAVID LIGHTFOOT 
Junior

1st Team Defense 
Linebacker 

Honorable Mention 
All South Plains 

Linebacker

V\aM®ante®

TRIMS
ARENOT

.US1SIII)

YOU CAN'T GET AROUND ME -C ody Stovall (32) plays good defense 
against a Hale Center player in the Championship game of the 3rd Annual 
Floydada Classic on December 3-5. Dusty Anderson (25) and Darryl 
Henderson (23) keep their players blocked out of the action. Whirlwinds 
- 44, Hale Center -53. Photo by Rhonda Stovall

LOCKNEY-Thc Lockney Long­
horns traveled to Friona December 3- 
S to participate in their tournament. 
They played Elida, New Mexico, 
Trinity Clvistian, Friona and Canyon.

LOCKNEY 64
ELIDA 34
Lockney rolled over Elida, New 

Mexico 64-34 in the first game of the 
tourney.

Thad Lusk was the leading 
scoremaker for the Homs. He scored 
13 points with 6 field goals and 1 free 
throw.

Josh Quebe scored 12 points with 
1 three-point and 4 two-point field 
goals. He also hit 1 free throw. Jor­
dan Lambert contributed 11 points 
with 5 field goals and 1 free throw. 
Turning in 10 points with 5 field goals 
was Matthew Lerma.

Calvin Collins made 3 field goals 
and 1 free throw for 7 points. Abel 
Rosales sank 2 field goals for 4. Three 
points each were made by Kevin 
Aufill and Ryan Graves. Aufill made 
a field goal and a free throw and 
Graves hit a three-pointer. Taurean 
McDonald added 2 with a field goal.

SCORES BY QUARTERS
Lockney 14 30 44 65
Elida 10 10 8 6

LOCKNEY 44
TRINITY CHRISTIAN 101
Trinity Christian swamped the 

Longhorns as they turn cold. The 
score was 101-44 at the final buzzer.

Thad Lusk again put the most 
scores on the scoreboard. He sank 2 
three-point and 5 two-point field goals 
for 16 points.

Matthew Lerma and Calvin Collins 
each racked up 6 points with 3 field 
goals apiece.

Ryan Graves scored 1 three-pointer 
and 1 two-pointer for 5 points. Jor­
dan Lambert added 4 points with 2 
field goals.

Kevin Aufill made two points with 
a field goal and Taurean McDonald 2 
points with free throws. Eddie Amaya 
added 1 with a free throw.

SCORES BY QUARTERS
Lockney 8 17 30 44
Trinity 22 54 77 101

LOCKNEY 46
FRIONA 62
The Friona Chiefs got off to a run­

ning start and led all four quarters of 
the game. The final score was Friona 
62, Lockney 46.

Thad Lusk made 23 points for the 
Horns. He hit 1 three-point, 9 two-

point field goals and 2 free throws.
Jordan Lam bert contributed 8 

points to the scoreboard with 4 field 
goals and 4 free throws. Matthew 
Lerma sank 3 field goals for 6 points 
and Calvin Collins 2 field goals for 4 
points.

Kevin Aufill and Mo Collins added 
a field goal each for 2 points apiece. 
Ryan Graves made a free throw. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 7 20 33 46 
Friona 13 33 48 62 
LOCKNEY 21 
CANYON 60
Lockney played the final game of 

the tourney against Canyon. They 
were cold in the first half but both 
teams played a fairly even last half.

Leading the scoring with 6 points 
was Thad Lusk. He made 3 field 
goals.

Taurean McDonald and Calvin 
Collins turned in 4 points apiece with 
2 field goals each. Jordan Lambert 
made a field goal and 2 free throws 
for 3 points. Two points each were 
contributed by Josh Quebe and Mat­
thew Lerma with field goals 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 5 11 15 24 
Canyon 24 46 54 60

CALVIN COLLINS 
Senior

1st Team Offense 
Running Back 

Honorable Mention 
All South Plains 
Running Back

FHS A ll-S outh  Plains

daV'

FLOYDADA JV BOYS 
By Coach Salazar 
FLOYDADA 38 
FRIONA 52
The FHS JV Boys opened the sea­

son with a match against Friona on 
November 20. The JV boys pulled 
ahead in the furst quarter, then seemed 
to bog down, finally losing 52-38.

Leading scorer for the team was 
Sean Holster with 13 points. Also in 
double digits was Clay Horn with 12 
points.

Other scorers included Amado Mo­
rales who made 6 points, Ed Porter 
with 4, and Todd Anderson with 2. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 10 10 9 9
Hale Center 9 20 7 16

FLOYDADA 52 
VALLEY 35 . . . . .
Moving to their socondgame *f the 

season, the JV bested Valley 5p-35. 
Holster was again the high point man 
with 19 points, including a 3 pointer.

Todd Anderson had 8 points and 
Amado Morales netted 6. Scott Nixon 
scored 5 points on free throws, mak­
ing 5 of 10. Adding 4 points each were 
Josh Caballero, Matt Rainwater and 
Clay Horn. J. D. Chaparro contributed 
2 points to the team effort.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 5 13 14 20 
Valley 6 14 6 9

FLOYDADA 51 
MATADOR 42
The Floydada JV had three players 

in double digits in the December 1 
game against Matador. Their efforts 
were responsible for the 51 to 42 vic­
tory which gave the team a 2-1 record 
for the season.

Edward Porter scored 16 points, 
Sean Holster had 12 and Amado Mo­
rales made 10. Clay Horn added 6 and 
Aaron Hernandez netted 4. Contrib­
uting 3 points was Scott Nixon. 

SCORES BY QUARTER 
Floydada 12 13 13 13 
Matador 8 9 10 15

COOPER TOURNAMENT 
FLOYDADA 49 
LITTLEFIELD 71
The JV Boys competed in a tourna­

ment at Cooper December 3-5. They 
lost the first game against Littlefield 
by a score of 71 -49. '

Leading scorer for the team was Ed 
Porter with 13 points. Also in double 
digits was Clay Horn with 11 points.

Other scorers included Sean Holster 
with 9 points, Amado Morales with 8 
points and Todd Anderson with 4. 
Scoring 2 points each were Scott 
Nixon and Matt Rainwater.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 6 14 7 22
Littlefield 22 14 20 15

FLOYD VDA 50 
IDALOU 62
Moving to their second game of the 

tournament, the team faced Idalou, 
losing 62-50. High scorer was Ed Por­
ter with 24 points.

Clay Horn added 9 points and 
Amado Morales made 7. Scoring 6 
points was Sean Holster while Todd 

I Anderson tipped in 5.
SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 10 12 12 16 
Idalou 26 9 II 16

FLOYDADA 60 
POST 53
The final game of the tournament 

I found Floydada in the drivers seat, 
beating Post 60 to 53. Three players 
scored in double digits with Clay Horn 

' leading the pack at 16.

Sean Holster added 15 and Amado 
Morales had 10. Others scoring in­
cluded Matt Rainwater with 6 and Ray 
Perez with 4. Adding two points each 
were Josh Caballero, Scott Nixon, and 
Todd Anderson. The win brings the 
teams record for the season to 3-3. 

SCORES BY QUARTER 
Floydada 14 16 15 15 
Post 16 10 10 17

FLOYDADA 9TH GRAD E 
BOYS

By Coach Buchanan 
RALLS JV TOURNAMENT 
FLOYDADA19 
RALLS 50
The9th grade boys competed in a 

junior varsity tournament at Ralls 
December 3-5. The team was unable 
to win any of their matches, but gained 
a lot from the experience.

Leadihg scorer for the first game, a 
50-19 loss against Ralls, was Anthony 
Suarez with 5 points. Scoring 4 points 
each were Rocky Reyes and Aaron 
Hernandez. Justin Reeves, Brandon 
Marler and Jonathon Martinez each 
made 2 points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 2 7 8 2  
Ralls 15 13 8 14

FLOYDADA 30 
SPUR 34
In the second game of the tourna­

ment, the team faced Spur, playing a 
closer game, the 9th grade Breezers 
only lost by 4 points, with the final 
score being 34-30.

High score honors were shared by 
three players, Aaron Hernandez, Bran­
don Marler and Justin Reeves. Each 
scored 7 points. Anthony Suarez 
scored 5 points and Allen Arvizu 
added another 4.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 8 6 5 1 1  
Spur 6 10 9 9

FLOYDADA 39 
OLTON 41
The final game of the tournament 

pitted the 9th graders against Olton. 
The team kept pace with their oppo­
nent throughout the game, ending up 
with 39 points to Oltons 41.

Justin Reeves had an exceptional 
game, scoring 17 points. Also in 
double digits was Aaron
Hernandez.Brandon Marler made 5 
points, Allen Arvizu had 4 and An­
thony Suarez made 2.

SCORES BY QUARTER 
Floydada 10 7 9 13
Olton 8 11 12 10

FLOYDADA 47 
LOCKNEY 57
Floydada 9th grade basketball team 

played Lockney again on December 
7. They played a very good and physi­
cal game. The fourth quarter turned 
out to be the best quarter for the 
Floydada freshman boys.

Leading scorer was Allen Arvizu 
with 5 field goals and 6 free throws 
for a total of 16 points. Close behind 
was Anthony Suarez for 4 field goals 
and 4 free throws for a total of 12 
points.

Brandon M arler contributed 7 
points along with Justin Reeves scor­
ing 4 points. Rounding out the scor­
ing was Aaron Hernandez with 1 field 
goal and 3 free points for a total of 5 
points. Norgaard made 3 free throws 
to help contribute to the total score.

, ■ L': ■ ; -
SCORE BY QUARTERS- 
Floydada 9 10 7 21 47
Lockney 14 14 17 12 57

FLOYDADA 8TH GRADE 
By Coach Evans 
IDALOU TOURNAMENT 
FLOYDADA- 39 
HALE CENTER- 22 
Floydada Breezers opened the sea­

son with a win over Hale Center. They 
started slow and continued to pickup 
the pace with a hard fought game.

Leading scoremakers were, Brady 
Rainwater, with 10 points and Andrew 
Arvizu, with 6 points.

Adding to the points were; Tyler 
Helms, 4 points; Dustin Covington, 2 
points; David Rodriquez, 2 points; 
Larry McNew, 2 points and Daniel 
Ochoa, 1 point.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 2 9 10 18
Hale Center 2 _6 2 12

FLOYDADA- 30 
ABERNATHY- 40
8th grade Breezers came up short 

in the second game of the tournament. 
We started slow and did not recover 
through the whole game. It was a 
game we should have won, but we let 
too many chances slip by.

Covington was the high scorer for 
this game with 10 points.

Other points made were; Tyier 
Helms with 2, Andrew Arvizu with 3; 
Larry McNew with 3; Derrick Griggs 
with 4 and Ruddy Castenda with 2.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 5 12 4 7 
Abernathy 14 10 8 3

FLOYDADA- 25 
OLTON- 32
The Breezers dropped their second 

game at the Idalou Tournment with 
another close game. All the way the 
Breezers had many chances to take 
control, but couldn't. These players 
work very hard to win their games. 
As the season continues they will get 
stronger and better.

Leading scoremakers were, Dustin 
Covington with 15 points and Derrick 
Griggs with 7 points.

Adding to the score was, Tyler 
Helms with 5 points and Andrew 
Arvizu with 4 points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 4 8 8 5
Olton 8 2 10 12

FLOYDADA -45 '“ '̂'̂  JJUTUiO 
RALLS- 2 6 * ' b iogbhfll 
The Breezers dominated Ralls, from 

the start of the game to the last horn. 
Coach Evans stated that the Breezers 
are becoming stronger, each game.

The high scorermakers for this 
game were Larry McNew with 14 
points and Brady Rainwater with 10 
points.

Other scoremakers for this game 
were; Tyler Helms, 5 points; Dustin 
Covington, 5 points; Daniel Ochoa, 
3 points; Ruddy Castenda, 2 points; 
Josh Van Hoose, 2 points; Jacob Mo­
rales, 2 points and Brice Bowley, 2 
points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 13 8 12 15
Ralls 5 7 9 5

FLOYDADA- 46 
NEW DEAL- 24
The Breezers started slow falling 

behind by 2 points at half. The 
Breezers came out angry at half and 
dominated the game at both ends of 
the floor and pulled away with a 20 
point victory.

Brady Rainwater was the high 
scoremaker with 15 points.

Adding to the score were, Tyler 
Helms with 6 points, Dustin 
Covington with 10 points, Brice 
Bowley with 4, Andrew Arvizu with 
8 points and Larry McNew with 2 
points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 8 4 19 14
New Deal 7 7 4 6

FLOYDADA 7TH GRADE 
By Coach Evans 
IDALOU TOURNMENT 
FLOYDADA 59 
HALE CENTER 18 
The 7th grade Breezers started the 

season off strong with a win over Hale 
Center to start the year. They contin­
ued the tradition of winning the Idalou 
Tournment like last year with wins 
over Hale Center, Abernathy and 
Olton. The group of young men show 
much promise for the future of the 
Whirlwind Basketball program.

Daniel Garcia with 16 points, Chris 
Wickware with 12 points and Ross 
Bennett with 12 points were the high 
scoremakers for this game.

Adding scores were, Luis Lopez 
with 2 points, D.J. Summers with 4 
points, Blake Pope with 6 points and 
Gqrald Henderson with 5 points. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
‘̂ ’̂ •'^I^oydada" 24 21 6 8

Hale Center 2 6 4 6

FLOYDADA 33 
ABERNATHY 29
The Abernathy game was close and 

hard fought all the way. The Breezers 
had to overcome a height disadvan­
tage to win the game. They played 
hard team defense to win the game. 
Blake Pope, Chris Wickware and 
Gerald Henderson played very hard 
as they had to stop Abernathy's main 
player who was 6'3 tall. This victory 
moved them into the championship 
game with Olton.

High scoremakers for this game 
were Daniel Garcia with 13 points and 
Ross Bennett with 9 points.

Also adding to the score were Chris 
Wickware with 4 points, Blake Pope 
with 2 points and Gerald Henderson 
with 5 points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 7 10 5 11 
Abernathy 8 6 6 9

FLOYDADA 25 
OLTON 15
Olton came out in a 2-3 zone and 

tried to slow the game. The young 
Breezers showed patience in working 
the ball for good shots and took con­
trol of the game to slowly pull away 
and bring the trophy home.

Ross Bennett was the top scorer for 
this ballgame with 7 points.

Adding to the score were Daniel 
Garcia with 4 points, Chris Wickware 
with 6 points, Blake Pope with 6 
points and Gerald Henderson with 2 

Continued On Page 8

FLOYDADA 46 
LOCKNEY 66

The FHS Freshmen team played 
Lockney on November 23 and came 
out on the short end with a score of 
66-46.

Leading the 9th grade basketball 
team was Edward Porter with 5 field 
goals for a total of 10 points. Sean 
Holster had 4 field goals with 1 free 
throw for a total of 9 points.

Also contributing to the score was 
Amado Morales with 8 points. Scott 
Nixon hit 1 field goal and 5 free 
throws for a total of 7 points. Justin 
Reeves had 2 field goals for 4 points, 
Jonathan Martinez had 2 field goals 
for 4 points and Allen Arvizo contrib­
uted 2 field goals for 2 points.

Rounding out the scoring was An­
thony Suarez for 2 field goals for a 
total of 2 points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 13 11 5 17 46 
Lockney 10 24 17 15 66
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By Coach Stovall
FLOYDADA"On December 3-5 

we hosted the 3rd Annual Floydada 
Classic. It was a great tournament with 
several good teams. Hale Center Owls 
and Floydada Whirlwinds played in 
the championship game. Hale Center 
won first place with the Floydada 
'Winds placing second. The score in 
the championship game was 53-44.

Smyer beat Clarendon 64-62 for 3rd 
place. Kress beat Silverton 59-43 for 
consolation and Post beat Spur 63-50 
for 7th place.

The Floydada Whirlwinds had 3 
players make the All-Tournament 
Team. They were Ticen Harper, Dusty 
Anderson and Justin McGuire. 

FLOYDADA 65 
KRESS 52
We opened the tournament with a 

65-52 hard fought victory over Kress. 
Every player on the team helped in the 
scoring.We came out hot in the first 
quarter hitting all of our shots then in 
the second quarter Kress seem to start 
hitting everything they put up. In the 
second half of the game we played 
good defense which helped us keep 
our lead.

Leading the scoring with double 
digits was Darryl Henderson with 12 
points. He also had 8 rebounds, 3 as­
sists and 2 steals. Also scoring in 
double digits for the 'Winds was Jus­
tin McGuire with 11 points with 8 re­
bounds, 3 assists and 2 steals.

Scoring 9 points each were Ticen 
Harper and Chad Turner. Harper had 
18 rebounds and 1 assist with Turner 
getting 7 rebounds, 1 assist and 2 
steals.

Dusty Anderson shot for 8 points 
along with 2 assists and I steal. Bran­
don Wickware had 5 points and 8 re­
bounds. Jeff Lyles hit for 4 points, 5

rebounds, 1 assist and 1 steal. Ruben 
Barrientoz conu ibuted 3 points and 4 
assists. Scoring 2 points each were 
Cody Stovall and J.J. Morales. Stovall 
also had I rebound and 2 steals. Mo­
rales turned in I rebound.

SCORES BY QUARTERS
Floydada 21 8 15 21 65
Kress 6 20 20 6 52

FLOYDADA 75 
SMYER 58
In our second game of the tourna­

ment the Whirlwinds played Smyer. 
We played a well-rounded game 
against a good team. For the second 
game in a row, every player contrib­
uted to the score.

The 'Winds had four players in this 
game score in double digits. Leading 
that scoring was Darryl Henderson 
with 14 points, 3 rebounds and 7 as­
sists. Close behind was Ticen Harper 
with a double-double. He scored 15 
points and had 16 rebounds. Dusty 
Anderson sank 1) points and had 4 
rebounds. 5 assists and 5 steals. Jus­
tin McGuire hit 10 points with 5 re­
bounds and 1 steal.

Jeff Lyles contributed 7 points, 6 
rebounds and 2 assists. Chad Turner 
scored 5 points, 2 assists and 2 steals. 
Cody Stovall hit 4 points. 8 rebounds 
and 1 steal. Also scoring 4 points was 
Brandon Wickware along with 4 re­
bounds.

Rounding off the scoring was 
Ruben Barrientoz with 2 points and 3 
assists and J.J. Morales with 1 points, 
3 rebounds, 2 assists and 1 steal.

This win puts us in the champion­
ship game against the Hale Center 
Owls.

SCORE BY QUARTERS
Floydada 20 18 10 27 75
Smyer 9 16 11 22 58

Lockney Boys 
Basketball Report

LOCKNEY JV 
LOCKNEY 25 
TRINITY 53
The Lockney boys junior varsity 

team came up short in their game with 
Trinity on December 1.

Jessie Ledesma led the scoring for 
the Lockney Junior Varsity. He made 
3 field goals for 6 points.

Adding five to the scoreboard was 
Kelsey Schumacher. He made 2 field 
goals and 1 free throw. Kris Jones 
scored 4 points with 2 field goals. 
Adding three points each were Chase 
Graves with a field goal and a free 
throw and Juan Gonzales with 1 three- 
pointer. Aaron Dietrich added 2 with 
a field goal.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 4 5 4 12 
Trinity 15 26 48 53

LOCKNEY 9TH GRADE 
LOCKNEY 48 
IDALOU 27
Lockney's 9th grade boys basket­

ball team outscored Idalou 48-27 in a 
game played at home on November 
30.

Leading the scoring was Brandon 
Alvis with 8 field goals and 1 free 
throw for 17 points.

Adding 10 pioints with 5 field goals 
was Mo Collins. Ttiming in 8 points 
for 4 field goals was Frankie 
Gonzales. 7 Points was contributed by 
Chas Westbrook. Adding 2 points 
each was Jamie Cerda with 2 free 
throws. Wade Miller and Chris White 
each made a field goal.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 11 27 38 48 
Idalou 11 16 25 27

LOCKNEY 8TH GRADE 
LOCKNEY 24 
IDALOU 44
Lockney's 8th grade boys fell to a 

tough Idalou team on November 30.
Cody Lass led the scoring for the 

Shorthorns with 8 points. He made 1 
three-point, 2 two-point field goals 
and 1 fixe throw.

Garrett Mathis added 5 pQint5.with 
'2 field goals and 1 fixe throw. 4 points 
were contributed by Matt McPherson 
with 1 three-point field goal and 1 free 
throw. Adding 2 points each with field 
goals were Ben Sherman, Todd 
Cotham and Jordan Martinez. Nathan 
Burson hit a free throw to add one 
point to the scoreboard.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 3 7 12 24 
Idalou 11 18 26 44

LOCKNEY 7TH GRADE 
LOCKNEY 33 
IDALOU 18
The Lockney 7th Grade Shorthorns 

rolled over Idalou November 30 by a 
score of 33-18.

Kirk Wilson led the scoring with 12 
points. He sank 5 field goals and 2 
free throws.

Michael Martinez scored 9 points 
with 4 field goals and 1 free throw. 
Adding 6 points was Jeran Butler. He 
hit 3 field goals.

Adding two points each with a field 
goal were Paul Amador, Sergio Solis 
and Paul Peralez.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 10 2 9 12 
Idalou 3 10 16 18

Floydada Girls 
Basketball Report

FLOYDADA 8TH GRADE 
FLOYDADA 14 
RALLS 26 
By Coach W are
The 8th grade girls lost to Ralls in 

a hard fought game.
Ragan Beedy was the leading 

scoremaker with 2 field goals and 2 
free throws for 6 points.

Adding to the scoreboard were, 
Ashley Norrell with 1 point, Maggie 
Hilburn with 2 points and Laura 
Reddy with 5 points.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 4 2 4 4  
Ralls 6 6 10 4

FLOYDADA 8TH GRADE 
FLOYDADA 18 
NEW DEAL 25 
By Coach Ware
The Floydada girls fell to New Deal 

in a close game.
The leading scoremaker was Laura 

Reddy with 7 field goals and 1 free 
throw adding up to 15 points.

Also adding to the scoreboard was 
Maggie Hilburn with 3 points. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 2 4 9 3  
New Deal 2 4 8 11

FLOYDADA 44 
HALE CENTER 53
In the championship game we 

played the Hale Center Owls and 
came out losing in a very physical and 
fast game.

Leading the Whirlwinds in scoring 
with double digits was Justin McGuire 
with 12 points. He also had 6 re­
bounds. Ticen Harper turned in 9 
points with 10 rebounds and 1 steal. 

Chad Turner had 8 points with 1 as­
sist and 2 steals.

Also scoring was Darryl Henderson 
with 6 points, 9 rebounds, 2 assists and 
3 steals. Brandon Wickware hit 5 
points, 1 rebound and 1 steal.

Rounding out the scoring was Dusty 
Anderson with 2 points, 2 rebounds, 
3 assists and 5 steals. Jeff Lyles also 
had 2 points, four rebounds and 1 as­
sist.

Cody Stovall had 3 rebounds and 2 
steals. J.J. Morales also had 2 steals 
and Ruben Barrientoz had 2 rebounds 
and 1 assist.

Our season record is now 5-2. 
SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 10 12 5 17 44 
Hale Center 19 11 9 14 53 
Coach Stovall adds, "We have 

played 3 good teams. Overall we are 
playing some pretty good basketball. 
We have been able to hit the boards 
and out-rebound our opponents and 
we have forced a lot of turnovers with 
our pressure defense. We need to be 
more consistent and continue to im­
prove. We have to start shooting the 
ball better and cut down on our men­
tal errors."

This weekend, December 10-12, we 
will be playing in the Smyer Tourna­
ment. We open against Southland and 
we are looking to continue to improve 
and hopefully win the tournament.

Whirlwinds beat 
Motley County
By Coach Stovall
FLOYDADA 59 
MOTLEY COUNTY 51
FLOYDADA-The Whirlwinds 

hosted Motley County on December
1 and came way with a 59-51 win.

We played a pretty good game in
which we really out-rebounded the 
opponent. We also had a good team 
effort in scoring. Leading the scoring 
for the''Winds wkh a double-double 
was Ticen Harper with 15 points and 
18 rebounds. He also had 5 steals and 
an assist.

Close behind with double digits was 
Darryl Henderson with 10 points. He 
had 6 rebounds. 3 assists and 2 steals. 
Adding to the score was J. J. Morales 
with 9 points, 2 rebounds, 2 assists and
2 steals.

Justin McGuire had 8 points, 4 re­
bounds and a steal. Dusty Anderson 
turned in 7 points, 2 rebounds and 3 
steals. Also scoring was Brandon 
Wickware with 4 points. 5 rebounds 
and 1 steal with Jeff Lyles scoring 3 
points with 3 rebounds, 2 assits and 1 
steal. Rounding out the scoring was 
Ruben Barrientos with 2 points. Chad 
Turner also had 1 rebound. 1 assist and 
I steal.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 10 14 16 7 12 59 
Motley Co. 8 12 12 15 4 51

FLOYDADA 7TH GRADE 
FLOYDADA 12 
RALLS 43 
By Coach Ware
The Floydada 7th grade girls are 

really improving both offensively and 
defensively.

Erika Williams was the leading 
scoremaker in the game. She made 4 
field goals for 8 points.

Also scoring were Sandra Sanchez 
and Amanda Dechant both with 2 
points each.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 2 2 4 4  
Ralls 14 16 II 2

FLOYDADA 7TH GRADE ^ 
FLOYDADA 18 
NEW DEAL 37 
By Coach Ware
The Floydada 7th grade girls fell to 

New Deal in a fast paced game.
Erika Williams was the leading 

scoremaker with 8 points.
A lyssa Bennett and Nikita 

Ledbetter added 4 points each and 
Veronica Garcia came in with 2 points. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 8 4 0 6 
New Deal 12 6 10 9

NOTICE
THE DEADLINE 
FOR ALL NEWS 

AND ALL 
ADVERTISING IS 

TUESDAY 
AT 3:00 P.M.

Kennels & 
(Janiebird Preserve

offers 
Dressed Quail 

$1.25 ea. or $14.00 doz.
Dressed Pheasant 

$5.00 ea. or $50.00 doz. 
Smoked Pheasant 

$ 8 .0 0
Contact. . .

David or Chad Frizzell 
or come by the kennels 

13 miles North of Lockney 
on Hwy 378 

652-2540 652-3697 
H ttp://w w w .ogo.com /tala

WHIRLWINDS WIN SECOND PLACE TRO PH Y - 
The 1998 Whirlwind basketball team won second place 
in the 3rd Annual Floydada Classic Basketball Tour­
nament which was held a t the Whirlwind Gym De­
cember 3-5. The Whirlwind team includes: (front row, 
L-R) Dusty Anderson,Ticen H arper,Cody Stovall,

Ruben Barrientoz, J J .  Morales; (back row, L-R) Coach 
Stovall, Ju stin  M cG uire, C had 'D irner, B randon 
Wickware, Michael Black, Darryl Henderson. Not pic­
tured is Jeff Lyles (due to injury in game) The AII- 
Tournamrnt Team included Dusty Anderson, Justin 
McGuire and Ticen Harper. Photo by Rhonda Stovali

Lockney varsity girls (defeat Trinity
LOCKNEY-The Lockney Lady 

Homs defeated the girls from Trinity 
by a score of 44 to 35 on December 1 
in Lubbock.

Nicole Mosley led the scoring with 
13 points. She hit 1 three-point, 3 two- 
point field goals and 4 free throws.

Jenna Ford added 11 points with 5 
field goals and 1 free throw. Meradith 
Burson and Brandy Collins each con­
tributed 5 points with 2 field goals ana
1 free throw.

Tessa Davis made 1 field goals and
2 free throws for 4 points. Courtney

Cummings made 2 field goals for 4 
points. Dana Martinez sank 2 free 
throws for 2 points.

SCORES BY QUARIERS 
Lockney 9 25 34 44 
Trinity 8 18 26 35

Lockney Girls Basketball Report
JUNIOR VARSITY 
LOCKNEY 35 
TRINITY 29
The Lockney girls junior varsity 

team defeated the girls from Trinity 
35-31 in Lubbock December 1.

Elizabeth Torrez led the scoring 
with 16 points. She sank 5 field goals 
and 6 free throws.

Shayla Brewer made 1 field goal 
and hit 6 free throws to add 8 points 
to the scoreboard.

Cris Amador made 1 field goal and
1 free throw for 3 points.

Karlon Hooten hit 2 free throws for
2 points. Making 1 field goal each 
were Holly Arjona and Isabel 
Villareal.

Lexi Jones and Traci McQuhae 
each made a free throw.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 12 24 29 35 
Trinity 3 10 18 29

LOCKNEY 36 
IDALOU 39
The Lockney 8th grade Lady Short­

horns fell to Idalou 36-39 in a No­
vember 30th game in Idalou.

Leading the scoring for the Lady 
Shorthorns was Cameron Kemp. She 
made 4 field goals and 2 free throws 
for 10 points.

Laci Schumacher made 2 field 
goals and 3 free throws for 7 points. 
Janee Hrbacek scored 6 points with 1 
field goal and 3 free throws.

Leslie Cuellar, Sabrina Gross and 
Vanessa Luebano added 4 points 
each. Each made 2 field goals. Jalie 
Dietrich made a field goal for 2 points. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lockney 6 19 26 36 
Idalou 9 20 30 39

LOCKNEY7TH 
GRADE GIRLS'

IDALOU 28
Lockney's 7th grade Shorthorns 

were defeated by Idalou's girls on 
their home court Monday, November 
30.

Melissa Hernandez led the scoring 
with 6 points. She sank 3 field goals.

Mandy Hancock rang up 4 points 
with 2 field goals and adding 2 points 
each were Cammy Lass, Laci Durham 
and Rose Anna (Tastillo.

SCORES BY QUARTERS
Lockney 2 8 12 16
Idalou 6 18 24 28

C O M E  
W A T C H  

O U R  K I D S  
S H I N E !

LOCKNEY 8TH GRADE LOCKNEY 16

C o n g r a tu la tio n s
M ark M cC orm ick

on being named

Texas Farm Bureau's Outstanding 
Young Farmer and Rancher

Photo by J. Royce Bradshaw
Mark, McCrae, Kelly and Maddolyn McCormick

**Small Town Friendly, Small Town Proud”

iiR S T  NATIONAL BANK 
INLOCKNEY 
102 North Main 

Lockney, Texas, 79241 
(806) 652-3355

WEST TEXAS NATIONAL BANK 
in FLOYDADA 

105 S. Wall
Floydada, Texas, 79235

(806)983-5116 M em ber F.D .I.C

Http://www.ogo.com/tala
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T.OCKNEY CLASSIC
Boys - December 10,11,12

Bottom Team 
is Home
Wears Light Color

Loser 
Game #3

PETERSBURG
Game #3 

Thursday - 4:30

MOTLEY COUNTY
Winner 

Game #3

KRESS

Loser 
Game #2

Game #2 
Thursday 1:30

ROOSEVELT
Winner 

Game #4
3rd Place 
Sat. 4:30

CHAMP

HART
Game #1 

Thursday 10:30
Loser 

Game #1 CLARENDON
Winner 

Game #1

Game #4 Fri.
Thurs. 7:30 RYF. 4:30

LOCKNEY

LOCKNEY
Winner 

Game #2

SAT.
7:30

Losers of Games 
# 2, #3, #4
Will play a round robin 
for Consolation
#2__________
#3__________
#4__________

ROUND ROBIN 
(Team on Left is Home) 

#2 vs #3 ■ Fri. 12:00 noon 
#3 vs #4 - Sat. 9:00 a.m. 
#4 vs #2 - Sat. 1:30 p.m.

Top Team Home 
Wear Light

LQCKNEY CLASSIC
GIRLS - December 10,11,12

LQCKNEY

£QC
SaL
12:00

Thursday - 6:00 

MOTLEY COUNTY
Friday
10:30

KRESS

Friday
6:00

7th Place 
10:30 
Sat.

Thursday - 3:00 

POST
3rd Place 

— 3100—  
Sat.

CHAMP

ROOSEVELT

Thursday - 12:00

PETERSBURG

Friday
1:30 PLAINVIEW .IV

Friday
3:00

Thursday - 9:00 a.m. 

HART

Sat.
6:00

1998

LHS students 
decorate care 
cen ter doors

By Brandi Wright
LOCKNEY-Mrs. Trecna Astons’ 

Early Child Professions (ECP) class 
and Individual Family Life (IFL) 
classes gave the residents at the 
Lockney Care Center gifts, that were 
not from a box, but from the heart. The 
residents did not receive individual 
gifts but on the doors to their room, 
the students decorated for Christmas. 
The decoration themes ranged from 
Christmas trees, snowmen, fireplace 
scenes, gingerbread houses, the sim­
plest being just "Merry Christmas" 
and a picture of Santa Claus.

The students did this to give those 
residents less fortunate a Merry 
Christmas. The ECP students were 
assigned this project as their semes­
ter test project. They were graded on 
neatness, creativity, and time con­
sumption. As the students did their 
project, they learned the gift of giv­
ing and the meaning of self discipline.

The response was astounding! The 
residents loved the scenic halls and 
doorways, as did their friends and 
family. The doorways show everyone 
that the students still care for those in 
the older generation.

If you want to see a festive Christ­
mas, go down to the Lockney Care 
Center and see the decorations and 
meet some very sweet and special 
people.

IF YOU HAVE 
CANCER,
WE CAN 
HEIR
ifnoi;you
CAN HEIR

AMERICAN 
’ CANCER 

1-800-ACS-2345 T SOCIETY

Floydada Boys Basketball Report
Continued From Page 6 

points.

SCORES BY QUARTER
Floydada 2 II 0 12
Olton 2 4 3 6

FLOYDADA 61
NEW DEAL 33
The 7th grade Breezers opened dis­

trict with a solid win over New Deal. 
Defense dominated the game leading 
the way to easy baskets. Gerald 
Henderson and Chris Wickware domi­
nated the board.

High scoremakers for the team were 
Daniel Garcia with 19 points and 
Chris Wickware and Gerald 
Henderson scoring 10 points each.

Also adding to the score were, Luis 
Lopez with 2 points, Ross Bennett 
with 6 points, D.J. Summers with 8 
points and Blake Pope with 4 points.

LHS STUDENTS DECORATE DOORS-Members of 
the Lockney High School Future Homemakers deco­
rated doors with a Christmas theme for the residents

at the Lockney Care Center. Several of 
who worked on the project are shown in 
of the doors.

the students 
front of one 
Staff Photo

MAYBE I'LL FIND IT UNDER THE TREE -  These youngsters visited 
the toy display at Yolanda's Craft Shop during the Holiday Affair at 
Lockney. -• Staff Photo

KIDCARE ID"Ray Gacha fingerprints youngsters for 
KidCare ID's at Mangold General Hospital's Health

Fair last Saturday in Lockney.
Staff Photo

HERITAGENEWSFORUM

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 13 16 16 7 
New Deal 4 8 14 7 
FLOYDADA 55 
RALLS 19
The Breezers took their second 

straight game in district by shutting 
down Ralls offense. They started 
strong with pressure and finished the 
game strong. This group of young men 
are worth the price of a ticket. They 
play hard and fast.

Chris Wickware was the top scorer 
for this ballgame with 20 points.

Adding to the scoreboard were, Jer­
emy Lloyd with 2 points, David 
Garcia with 6 points, Ross Bennett 
with 7 points, D J. Summers with 2 
points, Blake Pope with 8 points and 
Gerald Henderson with 6 points. 

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 10 12 14 12 
Ralls 8 0 6 5

http.7/www.heritage.org
2 14 Massachusetts Ave. N.E. • Washington D.C. 20002 • (202) 546-4400

“Poor” is a Relative Term
By Edwin Peulner

Talk about exaggeration. Earlier this fall the U.S. Census Bureau issued 
a report claiming there are more than 30 million Americans living “in 
poverty." But a closer look at these “poor" people shows them to be far 
less impoverished than you might think.

According to government data collected by my colleague Robert 
Rector, 97 percent of the households labeled “poor" by the Census Bureau 
own color televisions, nearly three-quarters have video cassette recorders, 
and 70 percent own cars.

A lot of the poor also own their own homes, 41 percent to be exact. 
And these homes aren’t small. The average poor person in America has 
440 square feet of living space, more than the typical middle-class resident 
of Paris, London or Vienna.

Very few poor people go hungry either. A 1989 survey by the 
Department of Health and Human Services found just 3 percent of 
Americans saying they “sometimes” do not have enough to eat. On the 
contrary, the chief nutritional problem facing the poor is obesity.

No one would deny that some Americans are truly needy. But 35.6 
million of them? Only if you accept the Census Bureau’s bizarre definition 
of poverty. For example, in determining whether someone is “poor,” the 
Census Bureau counts only current income, ignoring assets accumulated in 
prior years. So if Bill Gates had a bad year and made no income he could 
be labeled poor, despite his accumulated billions. This helps explain why 
more than 200,000 “poor” people own homes worth more than $300,000.

The Census Bureau also misses a lot of income. In 1996, the 
Department of Commerce determined that the aggregate personal income 
of Americans was $6.8 trillion. Yet the Census Bureau counted only $4.8 
trillion.

Where did the extra $2 trillion go? A significant portion went to the 
poor. In 1995 the Census Bureau said the income of the poorest 20 percent 
of U.S. households averaged only $8,350. Yet the Labor Department 
claimed these same households spent $14,607. In other words, the average 
“poor” household spent $6,257 more than the Census Bureau said it 
makes. And these figures don’t even include the value of government 
housing and health-care assistance.

The annual Census poverty report was created as a public relations 
gimmick to push President Lyndon Johnson’s “War on Poverty.” The goal 
was to enlarge the apparent number of the poor, thus building support for 
Johnson’s welfare policies.

Those policies did raise incomes in poor communities, by transferring 
money from those who work to those who don’t—or won’t. But these 
same policies destroyed many families. When the War on Poverty began, 
7.7 percent of children were bom out of wedlock. Today, due in large 
measure to welfare programs that discourage marriage, the illegitimacy 
rate is 32 percent.

By undermining hard work, self control and marital stability, the War 
on Poverty has harmed those it intended to help. The Census poverty 
report contributes to these misguided policies by inflating the population 
of the poor, giving liberals ammunition to push for more social spending.

It would be bad enough if the Census poverty report were just 
inaccurate. It’s unconscionable that it is used to promote the same 
programs that spawned urban decay in the first place. The next time you 
hear inflated estimates of how many poor people there are in America, take 
them with a grain of salt—or better yet, a whole salt shaker.

Note: Edwin Feulner is president of The Heritage Foundation 
(www.heritage.org), a Washington-based public policy research institute.

GETTING YOUR EYES CHECKED -  One of many free health checks 
available at the Mangold Hospital Health Fair was eye exams at Dr. 
Stewart Webb's booth. — Staff Photo

Th e  Big C ity Is A  Nice 
Place T o  Shop, 

but shopping at home 
is nicer.

Money spent here 
creates jobs and builds 

the com m unity.

When you w ant to 
buy, check our ads.

When you w ant to sell, 
advertise in our pages.

HARK! 
the

Lockney 
Angels Sing

Elementary students will 
sing Christmas Carols in 
an All-School Christmas 

Sing on Monday 
December 14 7:00p.m. 

in the cafetorium

Sponsored by the 
Lockney PTO

^ (a brief meeting will follow)

ARE THERE HUNGRY PEOPLE 
IN MY NEIGHBORHOOD?

It's an unfortunate fact.
Y ou c an  h e lp !

TC A  C ab le  TV, w o rk in g  w i th  S p ir it  
o f  S h a r in g  (SO S), is  c o lle c tin g  fo o d  fo r th e  h u n g ry  
in  o u r  a rea . W e n e e d  y o u r  h e lp  a n d  y o u r  d o n a t io n  
o f c a n n e d  o r  p a c k a g e d  n o n -p e r is h a b le  fo o d  item s.

' Y ou c an  b en efit!
Y o u r d o n a tio n  o f tw e lv e  (12) 12 o u n c e  

o r  la rg e r  c an s  o f  n o n -p e r is h a b le  g o o d s  fro m  
N o v e m b e r  16 th ru  D e c e m b e r 18 w ill  a llo w  fo r a 
$5.00* in s ta lla t io n  to  c ab le  se rv ice , o r  if  y o u  a re  a 

c u r re n t  su b sc rib e r, y o u  w ill re c e iv e  a  free* u p g r a d e  
to  y o u r  p re s e n t  se rv ice .

Call TCA CABLE TV 
today at 806-983-2911

i l 9  E. Kentucky (*Other restrictions .ind fees may apply)

http://www.heritage.org
http://www.heritage.org
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FLOYDADA TMSC A TEAM PLACES IN TOP TEN -  David Rodriquez 
(left) placed 5th in the 9th gt'ade science division at a recent TMSCA 
meet. Stephen Cuevas (right) placed 8th in the 9th grade number sense 
contest. - - Staff Photo

H epatitis B immunizations 
availab le  for nom inal fee

By Connie Barnett 
Lockney ScIkm)I Nurse 
LOCKNEY—The Health Depart­

ment as been working with our com­
munity to sec that our children arc im­
munized against Hepatitis B.

This is usually offered to children 
between the ages of 11 and 19 for a 
very small fee, usually S5.00 to 
$10.(K). Those of you that have started 
the scries of three shots need to finish 
them. The lower prices iu'c available 
for children under age 11 also.

These immunizations will increase 
in price once your child passes the age

S u p p o r t  th o s e  w h o  
s u p p o r t  y o u r  

C o m m u n ity - -

S H O P  AT H O M E !!

LAB PALS SELECTED—Students selected as C.E.I. C om puter Lab 
Pals for the w eek ofD ecem ber 7-11 at Lockney Elem entary School 
are (1-r) M artin  Mendoza and Cameron Gonzales Staff Photo

TMSCA team 
places 4th at 
Seminole meet

LOCKNEY-The Math/Science 
team at Lockney High School traveled 
to Seminole D^embcr 5th and com­
peted in a Math/Science meet. They 
placed fourth for sweepstakes.

Students and their places are as fol­
lows:

Jessie Ledesma; 7th in Calculator.
David Martinez: 6th in Calculator 

and 2nd in Number Sense.
Melissa Schaeffer: 5th in Math and 

6th in Calculator.
Brandon Hennagan: 6th in Science 

and lOth in Number Sense.
Holli Carthel: 9lh in Math and 8th 

in Calculator.
Kacie Young: 4th in Calculator.
Amber Wood: 7th in Calculator and 

5ih in Number Sense
Melanie Huggins: 5th in Calcula­

tor and 5th in Math.

of 19. They will be about S180.(X). So 
.save some money and possibly .save 
your child. Get him or her immunized. 
You can obtain thc.se immunizations 
from your family physician, the 
Health Department, or from Danny 
Clark at Clark's Pharmacy.

There is no cure for Hepatitis B.

LAB PALS CHOSEN—Students selected as C.E.I. C om puter Lab Pals 
for the w eek of N ovem ber 30 toD ecem ber 4 at Lockney Elem entary 
School are (1-r) D aniel A tkinson and  Carlos Arce. S taff Photo

ROLF SHERMAN

Rolf Sherman 
is certifled as 
private pilot

LOCKNEY—Rolf Sherman, seven­
teen year old junior at Kress High 
School, was a very happy young man 
recently when he bacame a Certified 
Private Pilot, which means that he can 
fly almost anywhere and carry passen­
gers along with him.

Rolf began working toward earning 
his license in 1992 when he was 
eleven years old. Joe Vaughn of Kress 
was his first flight instructor but Roy- 
dada resident, Mark Thompson of 
Miller Flying Service in Plainview, 
was his instructor when he earned his 
license. He soloed for the first time 
last January. To earn his license, Rolf 
passed a written exam last July and 
then an oral exam that lasted about 
four hours, as well as an extensive two 
hour flight test. His next stop is to 
obtain his instrument rating and com­
mercial license soon after his 18th 
birthday.

Rolf comes by wanting to fly natu­
rally since his father, Tommy, owns 
and operates Sherman Aviation in 
Lockney. His mother, June, is a 
teacher at Plainview High School. 
When Tommy and Rolf bought a 
Bellanca Scott together recently, it 
enabled him to be able to put in more 
flight time. Rolf stated, "1 have wanted 
to fly an airplane all my life." Now 
his dream has come true, due to his 
hard work and determination.

l it t l e  l o n g h o r n s  NAMED-Selected as Little 
Longhorns for the week of December 7 to II  at 
Lockney Elementary School were (1-r, back row) Denice 
Muniz, Tania Pesina, Lydia Mendoza, RIon Aufill, 
James Rockwell, Miguel Duron, Mario Comacho; (1-r, 
raw 3) Lexi Terrell, Polly Gomez, Lorenzo Salazar,
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Thad L usk and L acey A ston  
named 1998-99 Mr. and Miss LHS

LOCKNEY—Thad Lusk and Lacey 
Aston were named Mr. and Miss LHS 
for 1998-99 during an awards cer­
emony held Saturday November 7.

Also nominated for Miss LHS were 
Amy Davis, Sarah Martin, Dana 
Martinez, Lindi Miller, and Tessa 
Stapp.

Daniel Banda, Calvin Collins, Ryan 
Graves, Hank Henderson, and Brett 
McQuhae were nominees for Mr. 
LHS.

Miss Aston is a senior and the 
daughter of Ronnie and Trina Aston. 
Lusk is a senior and the son of 
Raymond and Martha Sue Lusk.

Also honored were Class Favorites, 
Most Studious, Most Dependable, 
Most Courteous, Class Clown, and 
Most Attractive.

CLASS FAVORITE
Seniors: Lacey Aston, Thad Lusk; 

Juniors: Nicole Mosley, Jordan Lam­
bert; Sophomores: Karlon Hooten, 
Chase Graves; Freshmen: Jenna Ford. 
Jared Lambert.

MOST STUDIOUS 
Seniors: Lindi M iller, Brett 

McQuhae; Juniors: Nicole Mosley, 
Danny Huggins; Sophomores: Mel­
issa Schaeffer, Jeffery Hunter; Fresh­
men: Melanie Huggins, Wade Miller.

MOST DEPENDABLE
Seniois: Ana Zavala, Calvin 

Collins; Juniors: Fany Cruz, Jessie 
Ledesma; Sophomores: Lexi Jones, 
Jeffery Hunter; Freshmen: Alana 
Callaway, Wade Miller.

MOST COURTEOUS
Seniors: Sarah M artin, Calvin 

Collins; Juniors; Leticia Garcia, Jessie 
Ledesma; Sophomores: Lexi Jones, 
Jeffery Hunter; Freshmen: Jenna Ford, 
Wade Miller.

CLASS CLOWN
Seniors: Lilia Mondragon, Chris 

Mayo; Juniors: Brooke Hooten, Josh

SENIORS RECOGNIZED— Lacey A ston w as nam ed 1998 M iss LHS 
and Thad Lusk Mr. LHS in cerem onies recognizing class favorites.

Photo Courtesy LHS Annual Staff

Quebe; Sophomores: Lexi Jones, 
Chase Graves; Freshmen: Vanessa 
Walker, Chas Westbrook 

MOST ATTRACTIVE 
Seniors: Lacey Aston, Sarah Mar­

tin, Tessa Stapp, Thad Lusk, Ryan 
Graves, Marc Wilson;

Juniors: Ally Clark, Courtney 
Cummings, Nicole Mosley, Kaci 
McLain, Jordan 'Lam bert, Jessie 
Ledesma, David Martinez.

Sophomores; Karlon Hooten, Lexi 
Jones, Desha Smith, Chase Graves, 
Kelsey Hooten, Kelsey Schumacher.

Freshmen: Jenna Ford, Alana 
Callaway, Je.ssica Gilly, Jamie Cerda, 
Frankie Gonzales, Jared Lambert, 
Tyler Snow.

A dance was held following the cer­
emony. The theme for the program 
and dance was "Magic Time Ma­
chine."

MR. AND MISS LHS NOM INEES-Students nomi­
nated were (1-r, back row) Daniel Banda, Calvin Collins, 
Ryan Graves, Thad Lusk, Hank Henderson, Brett

McQuhae; (1-r, front) Amy Davis, Sarah Martin, Lacey 
Aston, Lindi Miller, Tessa Stapp, Dana Martinez. 

_____________  Photo Courtesy LHS Annual Staff

' j l o i ^ d a d a  

School M e m
C o c k /ie i^  S c h o o l  M e y m

December 14-18
Monday

Breakfast- Juice, cinnamon toast, 
milk

Lunch- Chicken Fried Steak, 
mashed potatoes, green beans, pears, 
hot roll, milk

Tbesday
Breakf Juice, toast. Jelly, milk
Lunch I rito pie, pinto beans, spin­

ach, peaches, cornbread, milk 
Wednesday

Breakfast- Juice, scrambled eggs, 
toast, milk

Lunch- Pizza, corn, pickle spears, 
cake, milk

Thursday
Breakfast- Juice, pancakes, syrup, 

milk
Lunch- Burrito with taco sauce, 

Spanish rice, tossed salad, Jello with 
fruit, tostada rounds, milk 

Friday
Breakfast- Juice, cereal, graham 

crackers, milk
Lunch- Hamburger, french fries, 

lettuce, tomato, pickles, milk

December 14-18
MONDAY
Breakfast - Donut, cereal, toast, 

juice, milk
Lunch - Steak fingers/PBJ sand­

wich, mashed potatoes, salad, fruit, 
hot rolls, milk

TUESDAY
Breakfast - Sausage, cereal, toast, 

juice milk
Lunch - Sloppy Joc/ham & cheese 

on bun, french fries, fruit, corn, milk
WEDNESDAY
Breakfast - Rice, cereal, toast, juice, 

milk
Lunch - Turkey & Dressing/ 

ham, green beans, sweet potatoes, 
cranberry sauce, fruit, hot rolls, milk

THURSDAY
Breakfast - Ham. toast, cereals, 

juice, milk
Lunch - Pizza/corn dog, salad, fruit, 

milk
FRIDAY
Breakfast - Cinnamon rolls, cereal, 

toast, juice, milk
Lunch - Hot pocket, fruit, milk, 

pickle spear, fruit, milk

Perez com pletes  
course in electronic 
secu rity  system s

LOCKNEY—Air Force Airman 
Roger L. Perez has completed the 
electronic security systems assess­
ment apprentice course at Goodfellow 
Air Force Base, San Angelo.

The student was taught the funda­
mentals of communications systems, 
communication systems monitoring, 
and other basic applications of Depart­
ment of Defense and U.S. Air Force 
information security programs.

Perez will be assigned to Hurlburt 
Field, Fort Walton Beach, Florida.

He is the son of Julio and Josie 
Perez of Floydada.

The airman is a 1995 graduate of 
Lockney High School and a 1996 
graduate of American Commercial 
College of Lubbock.

Ryker Cabler, Amando Gonzales, Greg Gonzales; (1-r, 
row 2) Saul Gomez, Rico Rodriguez, Adam Contreras, 
Jam es M ercado, Jessie Perales, C aitlann  Wiley, 
Danetta McCullough; (1-r, front row) Reon Raissez, 
Scarlett Hernandez, Christopher Rodriguez, Jasmin 
Rodriguez, Nathan Mendez. Staff Photo

Our Place Drive In
402 N. 2nd. Flovdada 983-3003

D in n e r  B a s k e t s  o n  s a l e . . .  $ 3 .7 9
(Steak Fingers, Chicken Fried Steak, Fish, Chicken 

Strips & Popcorn Chicken)
P R IC E S  E F F E C T IV E  T H R O U G H  D E C E M B E R  24

Ask About Our Combo Meals!
Try a "NEW" Chicken Club Sandwich *3.19

Happy Hour Daily
3-5 Mon - Fri 3:30 -4:30 Sat.
Wann~up with Coffee or Hot Chocolate!

Let me help  
measure your 
growing insurance needs 
with a State Farm 
Family Insurance Checkup.

Sec Agent:
N IC K  L O N G

201 Ciilifornia, Floydada 
_____ _ 983-3441

SUM Ftrnt Inturmet Comptnin 
Horn* OtHcN: Bloomington, NHnolo
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STORMY WING 
Bull Bash Winner 
High Point Ride

KASEY ANDERSON 
of Amarillo 

Bull Bash Winner 
Pee Wee Steers & Calf Riding

HOLIDAY AFFAIR SHOPPERS AT SCHACHTS FLOWERS

CASEY BOWMAN 
of Lamesa

Bull Bash Winnner-Junior Steers

TERRENCE CHAPMAN 
of Lubbock

Bull Bash Winner-Mutton Bustin

SHAWN CHILDS 
of Spur

Bull Bash Winner-Junior Bulls

Advertising in this 
newspaper benefits you 

and the community.

■sS t

CHANCE RHODERICK 
of Silverton

Bull Bash Winner-Sr. Steers

The Hesperian-Beacon

Makes A  Great 
Christmas Gift! 

All Santa's elves 
recommend it!

Pheasant Hunter's
S u n r i s e  B r e a k f a s t

Saturday, D ece m ber 12 
5:30 a.m . til ?  $5.00 plate

Trin ity  Lutheran C h u rc h  
P ro vid e n ce  C o m m u n ity

S cram bled  eg gs, ham , sausage, b iscu its , 
gravy, Texas to as t, ju ice , m ilk, & co ffee

All proceeeds benefit Trinity Lutherans' Sunday School Program  
Matching Funds provided by Lutheran Brotherhood's  

Lano Estacado Branch # 8 9 1 7

JESSE SINOR 
of Plainview

Bull Bash Winner-Sr. Bulls

c

ĵWJT

T h e  lead story deserves in- 
depth analysis. You’ve got 
' 12 seconds."

Thomas Spraying
M ODERN TECHNOLO GY - COUNTRY VALUES

i f l i a . - - ,
mm

1 O

PRECISION AIR APPLICATION FOR ALL 
YOUR DRY FERTILIZER AND WHEAT SEEDING NEEDS.

Danny Thomas 
Lockney, Tx. 79241

(806)652-2152 (806)983-0247 (mobile)

Just 990 per quart!

Save 15%
List Price $139.10

$ 1 1 0 8 0

Part No 253782A1 
15W40 No 1 Engine Oil 

30-Gallon Drum

* * o , 1 r ^ M « w 4 r

*When you inirchasc a 30-gallon dnun of Case 15W40 or SOW No.l’̂ '̂  Engine Oil.

Brown's Implement, Ine.
Ralls Highway P.O. Box 718 Floydada, Tx. 79235

Uptime. A ll  the  tim e?
t)t99S CASE CORPORATION 

Piiflied M> the U S A All flight) flfservtd 
Cnf IH Ctw md IH irt registered trudemviit 

of CMt Corporsfiofl

CONGRATULATIONS
to the Mark McCormick Family

on being named 

"Texas Farm Bureau's 

Outstanding Young 

Farmer and Rancher"
Photo by J. Royce Bradshaw

Mark, Kelly, Madolyn & McCrae McCormick

from everyone at. . .
Lon Davis Grain Co. & Davis Farm Supply, Ine.

511 E. Houston, Floydada - 983-2554 517 E. Houston, Floydada ■ 983-2233
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FLOYD COUNTY NEWS

CAPITOL
COMMENT

U.S. SENATOR
KAY BAILEY HUTCHISON

Cantwell Irrigation Pipe Co.
iWperwiwv hr'mirH (lualitii work ihr first lime and ( vviy tinw!

Alum inum  Pipe & Supplies

Dumptruck And Backhoe 
Service

Western A g Dealer

140 Years Of Com bined  
Experience In Pipeline Work

Shorty Cantwell 
292-1175- Mobile 

Plainview 

Call U.S for
Irrigation Pipe Needs______

1(15 E. 24th, Plainview

0 Ij i i , Q

Randy Ware 
774-4987 - Mobile 

Plainview
S,, f )»• u  h lU,

Cy Freeman 
627-74.18 - Mobile 

I \ i l ia -995-3187

NOW is tbe TIMK

OITicc -  806-293-2506

Propane...
Your BUCKS always go further!
Propane gas is much cleaner, more  
efficient and much m ore economical 
than electricity.
W hether a propane fireplace, propane  
space heater, propane w ater heater, 
or propane clothes 
dryer - you can be sure 
you will save big 
bucks.

W ith propane it is 
am azing  just how  
m uch further your 
bucks will always  
go!

Propane...
it just makes events!

(And $$$'s !)

West Texaii Has, Inc.
-  Hwy. 70 - Floydada 

W r a  983-3366
Route Delivery Tank Sales/Leasing Tank Installation

Schweitzer saddle 
search in progress

TEX A NS SO U N D  O FF ON D R O U G H T RELIEF EFFORTS

Late last summer this column included a list of questions seeking 
readers’ opinions about issues currently in the forefront of public 
debate. As has been the case in previous years, your answers were 

overwhelming, and I would like to thank this newspaper for allowing me to 
communicate with you this way.

The next several columns will address both the questions asked, and the 
responses you provided.

The first set of questions I posed to Texans was:
1) This summer’s drought has taken a dreadful toll on Texas, particularly 

the agricultural sector of our state economy. Much of my work this summer 
has focused on getting federal assistance to those who desperately need it. Are 
you satisfied that both federal and state agencies have worked together as 
efficiently as possible to get drought relief to Texas?
Y es___N o___  What would you have done differently?

Forty-nine percent of you responded that you were satisfied with efforts 
to get federal assistance to those who needed it; 51 percent saw room for 
improvement.

And boy, did I get number of hot answers to this one. Here are some of 
your comments on this issue:

From La Porte: “Speed up the application process!’’
From Hempstead: “Relief was too long in filtenng down to those who 

need it.”
From San Saba. “The process for getting this aid needs to be more 

streamlined, and with less bureaucratic red tape.”
From Brookston: “Assistance is restricted to those with ‘X’ number of 

acres or more. It doesn’t help the little man. who needs help the most. I have 
a small acreage and try to raise bottle calves. This assistance won’t help me, 
so in essence I’m out of business.”

From Manvel: “The ranchers are complaining that they got the help too 
late for their herds. The hay was a welcome sight, but not nearly sufficient.” 

Fiom Atlanta: “They should have used the National Guard to deliver hay 
and other feed. It would give them practice in logistics.”

From RtKkwall: “The government should have given cash assistance 
right away.”

From DeKalb: “I suggest setting up grants for next year’s planting based 
on this year’s losses.”

From Crockett: “Federal government should have worked closer with 
the county agricultural agents.”

From Clarksville: “Cattlemen need more assistance. Farmers have a 
need for better crop insurance. Both need higher prices.”

From Romayor: “We need a new program to build up stix-'k ponds and 
another dam on the Trinity River in Anderson County for flood control, and 
to impound the water.”

From Pettus: “I wouldn’t do anything differently. They did a good job.” 
From Crockett: “The only thing that would help us is rain.”
From San Antonio: “The federal government should be engaged in long­

term water development projects.”
' A reader ffom Sbuth Texas more resigned to fafe wrote: “Drought Is a 

part of life. We have to live it.”
Regardless of how we earn our livings, we all have a stake in Texas 

agriculture. Last summer's drought, and our efforts to respond to it construc­
tively, have taught us lessons in how to deal with such disasters. I intend to 
work for quicker, more responsive drought relief measures when they are 
needed in the future— as inevitably they will be.

By Marisue Potts
From what began as a quest for in­

formation about his own Schweitzer 
saddle, writer Bruce McGinnis of 
Amarillo has been drawn into docu­
menting the life and times of a Mata­
dor saddle maker, H.H. Schweitzer.

An intensive search for information 
and whereabouts of all the saddles 
crafted by Houston Schweitzer from 
1922 to 1956 is underway by the long 
time Amarillo College professor. 
McGinnis, the author of Fences, Sweet 
Cane, and Reflections in Dark Glass, 
the Life and Times of John Wesley 
Hardin, is currently writing a book 
about the famed saddle maker and his 
accomplishments.

According to McGinnis, there is a 
certain mystique about the reputation 
of Schweitzer, that far surpasses even 
the fine workmanship of the self 
taught craftsman who began by re­
stringing and repairing saddles for 
Matador Ranch cowboys. "When 
people start talking about H.H. 
Schweitzer, there is an awe, a sense 
of reverence, that comes into their 
voices," he said.

Indeed, after Schweitzer was fea­
tured with a full page in a 1940 Life 
Magazine article about the Matador 
Ranch, he became something of a ce­
lebrity, as well as a lonely hearts go 
between. Young women wrote scores 
of letters to the only name and place 
mentioned in the text, H.H. 
Schweitzer, Matador, Texas, in hopes 
that they might exchange letters and 
possibly meet a real live cowboy. 
McGinnis is curious. Which cowboys 
on the Matador Ranch received such 
letters lead to a match?

Through material provided by the 
family and interviews with Bert 
Schweitzer, who worked with his fa­
ther for several years under the stamp 
of H.H. Schweitzer & Son, McGinnis 
is well along in his research on the 
book. However, many concrete facts 
about Schweitzer's life remain elusive.

"Exactly when in 1924, did he open 
his shop in the tin building in Mata­
dor, and exactly when did h» move 
into the brick building behind the 
Masonic Lodge?" he asks. "When was 
the Poinsettia tooling first used? 
Where are Catalogs 3,4.6,8 and 9? 
And were is the final order book? How 
many cowboys from ranches in sur­
rounding counties ordered 
Schweitzers? How widespread was 
his reputation?"

Perhaps one of the most challeng­
ing tasks McGinnis has set out for 
himself is trying to match as many of 
the existing saddles of the 1600's 
made with their original handwritten 
notation in the order book. To this end, 
he hopes to interview as many people 
as possible and get photographs of 
them with their saddles.

Since most of the Schweitzer 
saddles were made for working cow­
boys, of special interest are the rare, 
fancy saddles made for customers 
such as C.R. Wilson of Paducah. The 
Wilson saddle, completed in 1947, 
was hand tooled with a floral design 
set off with silver and gold trimmings 
for the then fantastic sum of $450.00. 
The owner’s name, C.R. Wilson, was 
carved into the front of the cantle and 
on the back, his brand. After Wilson's 
death, the saddle was sold, but the

Ml »
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COOPERATIVE 

GINS, INC.

Floydada 983-2884

family has no recollection to whom. 
Naturally, McGinnis would like very 
much to locate this saddle and feature 
it in his publication.

Meanwhile, on weekends and dur­
ing college breaks, McGinnis contin­
ues his search for any clues about 
Schweitzer and his artistry. People 
who have Schweitzer saddles or any 
information on the whereabouts of the 
saddles and other leather goods, or 
anecdotes about the saddle maker are 
urged to contact Bruce McGinnis, 
3401 S. Lipscomb, Amarillo, Texas 
79109, (806) 359-1007, after 6 p.m., 
or Marisue Potts of the Motley County 
Museum, Route 4, Box 115, Floydada, 
Texas 79235, (806) 983-1372.

BROWN'S IMPLEMENT
Wishes to introduce 
C. BRYRON BR O CK 
New Saies Manager

A Lockney native and graduate o f  LHS, Brock currently lives in 
Silverton. He is married to Shelley and they have two sons, Beau 
and Brooks. He enjoys sharing in club calf projects with his sons.

Brock states, "/ am very excited about my new position with 
Brown's Implement and /  am here to serve the local farmers. Come 
by our location on the Ralls Highway in Floydada or call me at 
983-2281."

Ferguson
Spraying

Office: 608 E. Houston, Floydada 983-2474 
Larry Ferguson Jo e  Hinkle

Mobile. . .983-1820 Mobile. . .983-7058
Hom e. . . .983-3820 Hom e. . . .983-5608

B ro w n 's  Im p le m e n t, In c .
P .O .B o x  718 Ralls Highway 

Floydada, Texas 79235 
8 0 6 ^ 8 3 ^ 8 1

Save money and down time by letting us perform your 
routine 1000 hour maintenance.

T H IS  IN C LU D E S  T H E  FO LLO W IN G :
C H A N G E  H Y D R A U LIC  FLU ID  AN D FILTERS
CLEAN S C R E E N  IN T H E  T R A N S M IS S IO N
C LEAN T R A N S M IS S IO N  B R EATH ER
C H A N G E  O IL IN M FD  D IF F E R E N T IA L  (IF  E Q U IP P E D )
C H A N G E  O IL IN M FD  PLA N ETA R IES  (IF  E Q U IP P E D )
C LEAN RADIATO R. O IL  C O O LE R  & A IR C O N D IT IO N E R  C O N D E N S E R  F IN S  
A D JU S T E N G IN E  VALVES A N D REPLA CE C O V E R  G A SK ET  
C H E C K  AN D A D JU S T BELTS
C H E C K  AIR FILTERS - CLEA N  O R  R EPLA C E AS N E E D E D  
C H E C K  CAB FILTERS - CLEAN O R REPLA CE AS N E E D E D  
C H A N G E  W ATER FILTER  
LUBRICATE ALL G R E A S E  F IT T IN G S

LABOR: R EG U LA R  P R IC E  S P E C IA L  PR IC E
T V ;0  W H E E L  D R IV E S  $ 268 .50  $ 235 .40
M FD  T R A C T O R S  $ 340 .50  $ 301 .95
4 W H E E L  D R IV E S  $ 397 .00  $34 8 .0 0

-  -  -  -  .  NO PARTS INCLUDED IN THESE PRICES - - - - -  
........................... * FREE WASH J O B S .............. ..

PINO  SPECIAL
Let us check your tractors horsepow er with our Com pu-Torque D ynam om eter. 
R egular price $62. - Save 20%  w ith w inter special for a Special Price of $50.00. 

LIMITED TIME OFFER. HURRY IN TODAY,
OFFER GOOD DECEMBER AND JANUARY

See us now for the best savings 
on the best pivot you can buy — Zimmatic 

interest rates as low as 5.95%.

3 WAYS to SAVE:
Choo.se one of these money-saving options:

1. $1,200 CASH REBATE*
*Bascd on new 8-tower Zimmatic

------------------OR----------------

2 .  LOW DOWN/
LOW INTEREST FINANCING
Choose from one of the.se
financing options:
• 5.95% interest rate with 5% 

down on five year financing
• 6.5% interest rate with 7% down 

on seven year financing
• 7.5% interest rate with 15% down 

on ten year financing
All these financing options have delayed
first payments until March I, 2000

OR

3. INTEREST-FREE FINANCING
No finance charge with just 
10% down
Balance due on January 1,2000

(A ll opiions arc cfTcctivc for Zimmatic systems ordered December 1. 1998 
through Dccemhcr 31. 1999.

Certain rcsthctHins and conditions apply.
See your Zimmatic dealer for complete details

RHODERICK 
IRRIGATION 
P. O. Box 129 

Silverton, Tx. 79257 
806-823-2139

ADAMS
WELL SERVICE 

720 N. 2nd 
Floydada, Tx. 79235 

806-983-5003

heaJmhilt and strength « mi can depend on today mid Imimmiii.

Register To  Win A New Zim m atic Pivot 
During Zim m atic's 30th Anniversary Celebration!
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JAMES HILL
Funeral services for James Hill, 79, 

of Lockney, were held at 2;00 p.m. 
Monday, December 7, 1998 at the 
First United Methodist Church In 
Lockney. Reverend Russell Byard, 
pastor, officiated.

Burial was in the Lockney Cem­
etery under the direction of Moore 
Rose-W hite Funeral Home in 
Lockney.

Mr. Hill died Saturday, December 
5,1998 at Mangold Memorial Hospi 
tal in Lockney.

He was born on December 4,1919 
in Floyd County to the late Patrick 
Henry Hill and Margaret Inez Whitfill 
Hill. He moved from Floyd County 
to Ellis County in the 1930's and back 
to Floyd County in 1938. He attended 
school in Ellis County and the Irick 
Community of Floyd County.

Mr. Hill married Myrtle F. Harkins 
Hill on December 6, 1952 in 
Plainview. She preceded him in death 
on August 13, 1992. Mr. Hill was a 
maintainer operator for Floyd County. 
He was a member of the First United 
M ethodist Church of Lockney, 
Lockney Volunteer Fire Department 
and the Lockney Senior Citizens As­
sociation, where he served as a Direc­
tor.

He is preceded in death by a son, 
Kenneth Don Hill on October 29, 
1948.

Survivors include four sons, 
Mickey Pennington of Brazoria, 
Travis Barton of Glen Bemie, Mary­
land, Alvic Barton of Woodward, 
Oklahoma and Dick Barton of 
Plainview; one brother, J.T. Hill of 
Seattle, W ashington; one sister, 
Maxine Parker of Mabank; twelve 
grandchildren and twenty-three great­
grandchildren.

The family suggc.sts memorials be 
made to Lockney Senior Citizens As­
sociation at 118 W. College, Lockney, 
Texas 79241 or to the First United, 
Methodist Church at 102 W. Poplar, 
Lockney, Texas 79241.

T.V. MCCLURE
Funeral services for T.V. McClure, 

83, of Silverton, were held at 2:00 
p.m. Saturday, November 5, 1998 in 
the First Baptist Church of Silverton. 
Reverend Edwin Norris officiated.

Burial was in the Floydada Cem­
etery under the direction of Myers- 
Long Funeral Directors.

Mr. McClure died Wednesday, De­
cember 2, 1998 at his residence.

He was a farmer and had owned and 
operated Pioneer Steak House in 
Plainview for many years.

He was a member of the First Bap­
tist Church in Silverton.

On December 26, 1937 he married 
his first wife, Earnestene. She died in 
1953. On April 4, 1970 he married 
Opal Brannon in Plainview.

Survivors include his wife; a daugh­
ter, Fay Paschal of Plainview; two 
sons. Garland McClure of Walnut 
Creek, C alifornia and Carroll 
McClure of Huntsville. Alabama; two 
stepsons, Walter Hill of Silverton and 
Freddy Hill of Canyon; a brother. 
Weaver McClure of Kress; two sisters, 
Vera Crain of Childress and Connie 
Lee Tomme of Birmingham, Ala­
bama; 12 grandchildren; and 12 great­
grandchildren.

The family suggests memorials to 
Hospice Hands in Lockney.

It
Works
Wonders.

American Heart i 
Association.^

r < 3 : >

COMMUNITY CHRISTMAS 
CANTATA CHOIR

Like to sing? Join the Community 
Chritmas Cantata Choir performance 
Sunday, December 13th at 6:00 p.m. 
| t  ̂ ^.^irsl Baptist Church in Lockney. 
Practice eaefi Wednesday at 8:00 p.m. 
at the First Baptist Church of Lockney 
Choir Room. All welcome.

COAT DRIVE
New Beginnings Sunday School 

Class at the Floydada First United 
Methodist Church is sponsoring a coat 
drive to collect clean used coats to be 
distributed to those in need of a win­
ter coat later this month.

Coats may be taken to the Method­
ist Church at 203 W. Kentucky or call 
Sarah Sanders at 983-2320 after 5:00 
p.m. or leave message for pick-up.. 
Donations will be taken until Decem­
ber 13.

SMOKED TURKEYS-HAMS
The Floydada Volunteer Fire De­

partment will smoke your Christmas 
ham or turkey, or other choice of meet 
on Monday, December 21 or Tuesday, 
December 22. Call Floydada City 
Hall, 983-2834 to reserve a spot.

SANTA ON THE SQUARE
The lighting of the Christmas tree 

at the Courthouse will be held on De­
cember 11th at 5:30 p.m. Immediately 
following Santa will be arriving. Santa 
will be located under the pavillion.

This
Week's

A n n o u n c e m e n ts
ALL-SCHOOL CHRISTMAS 

SING
All-school Christm as Sing. 

Lockney Elementary Cafeteria. Mon­
day, December 14th at 7:00 p.m. 
Sponsored by Lockney PTO.

DONATIONS FOR WALL 
OF PRIDE PARK

Donations will be taken for the Wall 
of Pride Park in Lockney for the pur­
chase of pansies. Any person or orga­
nization interested call Laura 652- 
2456 or donation cans will be located 
at First National Bank, Lockney and 
the Wilson Agency.

MASTER GARDNER'S 
MEETING

The Master Gardner's Meeting will 
be held January 6 at 6:30 p.m. at the 
County Extension Office.

FLOYDADA SINGLES
The Floydada Singles will meet 

Saturday, December 12 at 6:00 p.m. 
in the Senior Citizens Building.

CHRISTMAS OPEN HOUSE
The Annual Open House at the 

First National Bank in Floydada will 
be Friday, December 18 froom 9:00 
a.m. - 3:00 p.m. in the Bank Commu­
nity Room.

/ i l  ..ji

Christmas Wish List!
'97 SKYLARK 
'97 SUNFIRE 
'97 PARK AVENUE 
'98 GRAND AM 
'98 CENTURY 
'98 LeSABRE 
'98 REGAL 
'98 BONNEVILLE 
'98 TRANS SPORT 

4 door, Rear AJC 
'98 GMC JIMMY 4x4

$ 9500 
$ 9500 
$19999 
$10900 
$15600 
$16300 
$16500 
$16700 
$17500

or $177 
or $177 
or $375 
or $205 
or $303 
or $317 
or $321 
or $325 
or $321

month**
month**
month***
month*
month*
month*
month*
month*
month****

$19999 or $373 month****
M A N Y  M O R E  T O  C H O O S E  FR O M !

"ALL STILL UNDER FACTORY WARRANTY"
* $1000 down -t-TTL-60 months-8.99% APR-WAC
*• $1000 down +TTL-60 months-9.24% APR-WAC 

$2000 down -fTTL-60 months-9.24% APR-WAC 
$2000 down +TTL-60 months-8.99% APR-WAC

CITY AUTO
Floydada, Tx.
806-983-3767

BUICK-PONTIAC-GMC

lining Wiitkr̂
- By Edward'MarksB

Like the woman at the w6ll, I drayik ftxjm the water of f i f e ^  
I searched for peace the world} that’s With strife.

I sought pleasure from the^world, only to find pain. ' '
I found no happiness, as I thirsted for ea j^ ly  gain.

® □
I began to  think, I would never again be free^

A slave in bondage, adrift upon Jlfes aiigry^.sea; ‘ 
Then I came to the well; to drinioonfc last time.

I had decided to end niy search; and coronet tijy last crime.

Then I saw him at the well, as he stood there waiting ph me, 
"Drink from my living water, th^t I shall give torthee."

He passed me the cup, with his nail scarred’hah'ds^
As I drank my thirst ended, and I would never thirst , again.

Snatched from the dungheap of life, I ^ a s  m ad i^ho le .
My sins had beenJorgiVen, never to remember anymore. 

Jesus offers thi^ life g iv ih^w aterto  all,
The most barren desert, yields to his holy waterfall.

The chains of bondage were broken, upon that faitttfuilday.
I now serve a new master, a debt I can never repay.*/ u 

My life has been reborn, I am a brand new man.
He's poured out his living waters; upon this barren land.

I no longer fear a world, that's dark, angry, and cold.
I can now face the world, with joy and peace so bold.
Do you know this one, who stands at the well of love?

Have you drank his living water that flows frOm God above?

He restored m y soul and set my spirit free^
I now have a captain upon lifes stonpy seas.

I owe it all to the man I met at the well.
As Ttravel about my life his story I will tell.

Have you come to the place in life you cahnot bare?
Are you wondering if there is anyone out there who cares? 

Kneel before Jesus and driiik from his life giving cup. 
Though you are drowning in* tragic waters he will lift you up.

John 7:37-38

PUBLIC NOTICE

SOUTH PLAINS COMMUNITY 
ACTION ASSOCIATION

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL 
AUTO MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICE

Auto Maintenance and Repair Services are being procured for agency 
vehicles. Interested parties will:

** Provide pricing/cost for services at regular rates and government 
rates
** Possess a thorough knowledge and understanding on variety of 
vehicles
** Possess a thorough knowledge and understanding of Alternative Fuel 
systems
** Have capacity to perform an analysis of repair needs 
** Provide input into labor cost involved 
**Provide warranty information for services 
**Provide list of certified technicians or qualifications 
’"’"Address all other request in proposal packet

If interested, request an Auto Maintenance and Repair Proposal Packet 
from:

Administrator #226 
P.O. Box 610 

Levelland, Texas 79336

12-10, 12-17C

THE ESTATE OF 

LUCY J. EASTHAM  

DECEASED

NO. 5440

§ IN THE PROBATE COURT

§

§ FLOYD COUNTY, TEXAS

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice is hereby given that original Letters Testamentary for the Estate 

of Lucy J. Eastham were issued on November 24, 1998 under Docket 
No. 5440, pending in the County Court of Floyd County, Texas to: Carmel 
Eastham.

Claims may be presented in care of the attorney for the Estate addressed 
as follows:

Representative,
Estate of Lucy J. Eastham 

do  Jennifer B. Horn 
Attorney at Law 

Post Office Box 189 
Floydada, Texas 79235

All persons having claims against this Estate which is currently being 
administered are required to present them within the time and in the 
manner prescribed by law.

Dated this 10th day of December, 1998.

The Holiday Affair in Lockney was really n ice^
At Evelyn and Gladys' we had a lot of fun and saw a ,oi ^ ^ i

had not seen in a while. The pf^^wcbsicr ihe^iHows we
Rayanna Glasson won the wreath and

g a v e l r d o o r p r i^ .  Ifnd Gladys

We want to thank each of you for your thoughts, pray en,
cards, flowers, gifts and calls while Joe has receive is 
transplant and is continuing receiving care at ay or ni
versity Medical Center in Dallas.

Your friendship means a lot to us and we are oo ing
forward of being home soon.

Joe and Becky Rainer 
Sharia Rainer 
Shelli and Lyndon Hill

The family ofimadell Ezzell wishes to express thanks to the hos­
pital, Dr. Mangold, Dr. White, the nurses, the Lockney Care Center 
Rest Home and friends who came by. Imadell loved this place and

the people. Thank you again,
Lillie Warren 
Sherra Cate
Jessie Arjona j i

^ -------------------------------------- ---------------------  ^

" '' 
We want to thank each ofyou for your thoughts, prayers, 

cards, flowers, food and calls during the loss of my son, 
Jack Jarrett. We appreciate all that you have done. May 
God bless each of you.

Grace Jarrett 
Nedra and Richard Pruett

Central nervous system cancer 
drugs may stop spread of cancers

By Judy Baldwin
New drugs, injected into the fluid 

that circulates around the brain and 
spinal cord, may stop the spread of 
specific cancers, says a researcher at 
Texas Children's Cancer Center and 
Hematology Service in Houston.

"These drugs are promising for tu­
mors that tend to spread to the central 
nervous system as well as for the treat­
ment of recurrent leukemia or leuke­
mia resistant to treatment," said Dr. 
Susan Blaney, an assistant professor 
of pediatrics at Baylor College of 
Medicine and principal investigator of 
the drugs' research study.

"We are hopeful that these drugs 
will result in improved treatment," she 
said.

Currently, there are only three drugs 
available to treat cancers that spread 
throughout the central nervous sys­
tem. Cancers that use the fluid to

spread include leukemia, lymphoma 
brain tumors, lung cancer, breast can 
cer, and some childhood tumors.

"Ultimately, we hope that these 
drugs will not only treat patients 
whose cancers have already spread to 
their central nervous systems, but also 
prevent the development of such 
spread in cancer patients who have a 
high risk for it," Blaney said.

A team of researchers from Baylor 
College of Medicine, Texas Children's 
Cancer Center and Hematology Ser­
vice, and Texas Children's Hospital 
developed the new drugs.

Texas Children's Cancer Center and 
Hematology Service is jointly affili­
ated with Baylor College of Medicine 
and Texas Children's Hospital.

Phase II of the research study be­
gins in 1999 and will be done in col­
laboration with institutions through­
out the United States.

Keep Up With Your Local News
Subscribe to The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon 

and it will be delivered to your door!

In County $16.00 Out Of County $17.00 Out Of State $18.00

PUBLIC NOTICE

BASIC CABLE CHANGES
Attention TC  A Cable TV  subscribers in Floydada. Effective 
D ecem ber 31 ,1998 TC A  Cable TV  will m ake the following 
changes to the basic channel line-up. T rin ity  B roadcasting 
N etw ork will be added on cable  channel 27. The Travel 
C hannel will no longer be available. Inquiries concerning 
these changes or any other cable  related  issue can be m ade 
at the TC A  Cable TV  O ffice located at 119 E. Kentucky 
Street or by calling 983-2911.

12-3, 12-10, 12-17, 12-24, 12-31c

Jennifer B. Horn 
Attorney for Applicant

12-lOc

PUBLIC MEETING

Thursday, D ecem ber 10, 1998 

6:30 p.m .

School A dm inistration O ffice B oard R oom  
226 W est C alifornia Street 

Floydada, Texas

A cadem ic Excellence Indicator System  R eport 1997-98

_______________________________________________ 1 ^ 3 ,12-lOc

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

The Commissioner's Court of Floyd County will accept sealed bids until 
10:00 a.m. Monday, December 14,1998 for the purchase of the following:

I Sheriffs Department!] One (1) new 1998 or 1999 4-door car

INSTRUCTIONS:
Bidding specifications for the above are available in the County Judge's 
Office, Courthouse Room 105, from 8:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m., Monday 
thru Friday.

All bids should be delivered to: County Judge, Floyd County Courthouse, 
Room 105, Floydada, Texas 79235. Bids shall be sealed when presented 
and will be opened at the above time and date. Please indicate "Bid 
Enclosed" on envelope.

Payment will be made in cash upon delivery and approval. Floyd County 
reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids and right to waive all 
formalities.

COMMISSIONER'S COURT, FLOYD COUNTY, TEXAS 
BY: WILLIAM D. HARDIN, County Judge

11-26, 12-3, 12-lOc
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A bT O M O TIV E  FOR SAFE

WE RENT CARS—Floydada-Ford-Mer- 
cury - 983-3761, toll free 1 -877-983-3761.

2-1 Ic

l ) a ^ A  n O i\S  NEEDED

TROOP 259 NEEDS UNIFORM dona­
tions. Pants needed most. Call 652-3627.

12-lOc

G A R M iE S M .E S

Floydada
CLOSEOUT SALE~Everything has to 
go. 100 S. Main. Floydada. Tliursday, Fri­
day, 8:00 a.m. • 6:00 p.m. and Saturday, 
8:00 a.m. - ??.

12-lOc

FARM EQUIPMENT FOR SALE

8 ROW PHARES & WILKINS double 
stalkcutter. Call 983-2151 or 983-2052.

tfn

GARAGE SALE-102 S. 5th Street. Old 
Commercial Hotel. Enter on north door. 
Saturday, December 12 -10:00 a.m. - 3:00 
p.m. Ridiculously low prices. Everything 
must go.

12-lOc

1994 ZIMMATIC CENTER PIVOT-
Call 806-823-2139.

12-31C

HAY FOR SALE

FOR SALE: HYBRID SUDAN. Round 
bales. By bale or ton. 806-983-2969.

12-3IC

FARMS/RANCHES FOR SAIM

320 ACRES OF IRRIGATED LAND
in McCoy Community. Two wells and all 
mineral rights included. Larry S. Jones, 
Broker. 983-2151.

tfn

H ELP WANTED

FARMHAND NEEDED-Experienced 
in furrow and pivot irrigation. Send re­
sume to Box 1641, Plainview, Texas 
79073-1641.

12-lOp

HIGHWAY FRONTAGE 219 ACRES 
semi-irrigated farm at $375.00 per acre. 
Located 8 miles west of Silverton and 7.5 
miles south of Lockney on Highway 387 
and 1 mile west on Kress Highway; or, 
15.5 miles north of Lockney on Silverton 
Highway 387 and 1 mile west on Kress 
Highway at junction of County Road #3. 
Call 806-347-2248.

12-3c

HAVE BUYERS FOR CRP land in 
Floyd and surrounding counties. Call 
Turner Real Estate at 983-2635.

tfn

HOUSES FOR SAI.E

Floydada
NICE 2 BEDROOM, 2 BATH, double 
garage. Brick home with fireplace on 
Ralls Highway.— PRICED TO SELL— 
- 2 bedroom, 1 bath, fireplace, Mississippi 
Street; -3 Commercial Properties; -160 
acres irrigated farm on highway near 
town. Call Sam Hale, Hale Insurance and 
Real Estate, 106 S. Main, Floydada, 983- 
3261.

tfn

FOR R E N T  OR SA L E
Floydada

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom house. 293- 
5222.

tfn

NOTWEARINGA
SAFETYBELTCANCOST
YOUANARN&AtEG.

NICE HOUSE FOR SALE-Central air

PUBLIC NOTICE

CONTRACTOR’S NOTICE OF TEXAS 
HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE WORK

Sealed bids for mowing highway right of way will be received at the 
Texas Department of Transportation, 135 Slaton Road, Lubbock, Texas 
79404.

COUNTY; Floyd
HIGHWAY; US0070
ESTIMATE; $145,656.00
PROJECT NUMBER; RMC-603539001
PRE-BID MEETING: December 3, 1998, 9:30 a.m.

LUBBOCK DISTRICT CONFERENCE ROOM 
135 SLATON ROAD 

LUBBOCK, TEXAS 79404
(This meeting is not mandatory, but is highly recommended 
that bidders be in attendance.)

GUARANTY: $3,000.00
Only a cashier’s check, money order, or teller’s check on a State or 
National Bank, on a State or National Savings and Loan Association or 
a State of Federal Chartered Credit Union for the guaranty amount listed 
above will be accepted. The Proposal Guaranty must be in the amount 
stated and may be payable at or through the institution issuing the 
instrument or may be drawn on a non-bank and payable at or through a 
bank. The Department will not accept personal checks, certified checks, 
or types of money orders and bid bonds.

Bids received until 9:50 a.m. December 17, 1998.
Bids will be publicly opened and read at 9:50 a.m. December 17, 1998.

MAIL PROPOSALS TO;
ATTN: ANN FINLEY
TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
P.O. BOX 771
LUBBOCK. TEXAS 79408-0771

DELIVER PROPOSALS TO;
ATTN: ANN FINLEY
TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
135 SLATON ROAD 
LUBBCXTK. TEXAS 79404

Approximate limits of work: North county line to south county line and 
east county line to west county line. Plans are required for this project 
and may be obtained from plan companies.

Questions regarding this proposal may be addressed to:

Mike Craig, Area Engineer 
P.O. Box 148 
Plainview, Texas 79072

OR
Ann Finley, Contract Tech 

806-748-4403

Bidding proposals are issued to pre-qualified bidders only. Pre- 
qualification information and questionnaire may be obtained from the 
Maintenance Division. Austin, at 512-416-2496 or from the District 
Maintenance Office. Lubbock, at 806-748-4403.

Bid proposals may be requested from the Maintenance Division, Austin, 
by telephoning 512-416-2496 or by contacting the District Maintenance 
Office in Lubbock at 806-748-4403.

11-17, 11-26, 12-3, 12-lOc

HOUSES FOE SA LE
Floydada

BY OWNER: 3 bedroom, 2 bath, stucco 
house. Central heat and air, fireplace. 
Double garage, workshop. 602 S. 5th, 
Floydada. 24x50 feet building on sepa­
rate lot.

12-lOp

M ISCELLANEOUS

BARBIE DOLL CLOTH ES-3 for 
$4.(X) and get one free. Tot’s Delight - 296- 
9483.

12-17p

Http://www.DanCoWeb.com
12-17p

TWO STORY LIVING is unusual for 
Floydada, but you can have it in this three 
bedroom, two bath home with fireplace 
and lots of living space. Call Jones En­
terprises, Broker at 983-2151.

tfn

ARTIFICIAL 7 FOOT FLOCKED 
Christmas tree and decorations. Call 983- 
5084 for information. Easy to assemble.

12-lOp

THE MOST UNIQUE HOME in 
Floydada with the most secure environ­
ment. Three bedroom, two and one-half 
baths, indoor garden area, double fire­
place and separate guest quarters. Not 
only can you live here, but also have in­
come potential at the same time. For your 
private showing call Larry at 983-2151.

tfn

HOUSE SETTLING?~Cracks in the 
walls, ceilings, or bricks? Free estimate.s 
and inspection. Childers Brothers 1-8(X)- 
299-9563.

7-lp

LEMEL CAKE CANDLES for sale. 
Call Larsen Framing, 706 Broadway, 
Plainview. 293-9979.

12-17C

FOR SALE BY OWNERS: 3 bedroom. 
2 bath, 2 car garage with workcenter, cen­
tral heat and air, covered cellar with lots 
of storage, fenced backyard with it’s own 
water well. Located in beautiful neighbor­
hood. 825 W. Kentucky. Call 983-2203.

tfn

EVERYTHING ON SALE NOW 
THRU CHRISTMAS. Wreaths, ceram­
ics, collectables and lots of other gift 
items. Velma’s Gifts - 1122 S. Main, 
Floydada.

12-24C

Lockney
FOR SALE-3 BEDROOM, 1 bath 
house on 1.2 acres. Completely remod­
eled. 705 S.W. 11th, Lockney. Call for an 
appointment 806-256-2485 after 4:00 
p.m.

12-24p

LET ME CROCHET FAMILY HEIR­
LOOM for anniversary, wedding, Christ­
mas, birthday. Any name 220.00, heart 
$40.00, double heart $60.00. Betty 652- 
3180.

12-17p

WEST FLOYDADA-Good location! 
Four bedroom, two baths, two car garage 
and more. This home is a great family 
home. Call Jones Enterprises, Broker at 
983-2151.

tfn

LOTS FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Lots 4, 5 & 6. Block 21, 
Original Town of Floydada. Call Monte 
or Tom at 983-3717.

tfn

M O BILE HOM ES
REPO RODEO—$499.00 down with 
payment starting at $122.77 a month. Sev­
eral to choose from. Singles and Doubles. 
Call toll-free 1-877-749-4063-11.99 
Fixed A.P.R.-180 months - Stk#CH5438.

I2-17C

ONE BLOCK FROM DUNCAN 
SCHOOL-This 3 bedroom home would 
make a great starter home. Call Jones 
Enterprises, Broker at 983-2151.

tfn

LOT FOR SALE-Comer of Marivena 
and Wall Street. 2 lots with old building. 
$6,000.00 cash. For details call Sam Hale 
Insurance and Real Estate.

12-31 p

GOT LAND? NEED A HOME?? Call 
today and see how you can use your land 
for downpayment. Toll-free 1-877-749- 
4063.

12-17C

tfn

\

O u t p o s t
OF FREEDOM

The framers of our Constitution didn’t wait 
very long to make their wishes known 

about maintaining a "Free Press."
In the very first Amendment, they clearly 

stated, “Congress shall make no laws 
respecting an establishment of religion, or 

prohibiting the free exercise thereof: or 
abridging the freedom of speech, or of the 

press; or the right of the people peaceably to 
assemble, and to petition the Government 

for a redress of grievances."
Newspapers guarantee our right to be free!

The
Floyd County 

Hesperian -Beacon

PHEA SA N T MOUN TING

PHEASANT MOUNTING-21 years 
experience. Call Mike Anderson at 806- 
983-2186.

12-26p

RECREATIONAL I EHICEES

5TH WHEEL - RV TOW TRUCK- 
Ford F-350. Crew Cab Dually. Complete 
with hitch. LOADED - EXTRA SHARP, 
LOW MILEAGE. $9,750.00. Call 806- 
983-3535.

12-IOc

•  For your
I  CRP GRASS SEED NEEDS
•  * Quality Seed
•  • Competivie Prices
•  * Delivery Available
•  Customer Service and Satisfaction
^ is our Goal!
•  GRASS SEED SERVICES, INC.
•  1-800-457-8742
•  (DRILLERS WELCOME)

SERVICES

BUDDY’S HAULING & MOVING -
Trash, old cars, tree limbs. 296-9483.

12-17p

"MASSAGE THERAPY AT ITS 
BEST" -Pat Wingo, RMT, NCMTB. 
Thursdays 9:00 a.m. - 6:(X) p.m. 806-983- 
8096. Gift certificates available.

12-31p

POOLE 
W E L L  SER V ICE

Complete Irrigatioil 
Well Service 

Simmons Pumps 
High Speed BaUing

704 M atador Highway  
983-2285 983-5610
Business Redifrnce

TRIMCO CONTRACTING AND 
SERVICES -General carpentry, remod­
eling, repairs. Experienced with refer­
ences. Contact Monte Covington, 983- 
7777 or 652-2903.

12-17p

LARRY OGDEN AUCTIONEERING-
Estates, Farm, Ranch, Business, Liquida­
tions, State Licensed and Bonded. (806) 
983-5808. TX. #9240.

tfn

SCRIPT PRINTING 
& OFFICE SUPPLY
* Commerical Printing 

* Office Supplies & Furniture 
* Business Machines

108 S. Main Floydada 983-5131

WANTED: HEAVY DUTY PLOW- 
ING-CRP, Wheatland. Comland. Call 
983-3744.

tfn

COTTON HARVESTING WANTED: 
Let us strip your cotton. We have JD 7445 
stripper, boll buggy and standard size 
module builder. Francis Montandon 652- 
3696.

tfn

ADAMS
W ELL SER VIC E

Complete Irrigation Service
5 Year Warranty, Domestic Pump 

High Speed Bailing

720 N. 2nd 
983-5003

PAINTINGS FOR SALE

PRINTS OF 6 FAVORITE PAINT­
ING- Signed and numbered- Now avail­
able for gifts or home. Matted and/or 
framed. $25.00 - $75.00. Jill Warren 983-
5840. J ^

12-17C

WE DO QUILTS! Custom hand guided 
machine quilting. Let us finish those quilts 
tops for you. Cheryl and Danny Daniel. 
983-5952.

l-14p

TREES REMOVED OR TRIMMED. 
New fences built, old fences repaired. 
Firewood. 296-5646.

12-17p

fECONOMICAL S T O R A C rj 
[ TR Y BARKER'S }
I Jewel Box Mini-Storage |
I and save your time and money| 
I Phone 652-2642 I
I Com er Main & Locust L o c k n ty .T v x n  |
^  Barker Building J

STORAGE FOR R E N T

INSIDE STORAGE for R V.’s, boats, 
cars. Call Russell Equipment 983-3535.

tfn

Have a nice day!

CRH
SYSTEMS
116 W. California 
983-2445 983-3151 

'For All Your Computer Needs* 
Visit Our Showroom  
Everyday Low Prices

[ R A M S O N  

^ A L  ESTATE

2703 24th St. Plainview 
293-5212

Rusty Wilson, Lockney......652-1106
Tom or Francis Adamson... 296-7228
Rob or Cecilia Wilson___293-5722
Laura Simmons____ 684-257(5̂

http://www.texasonline.net/Adamson

205 S.W. 7th, LOCKNEY-Brick, 2 bedroom with basement, central heat and air, large 
kitchek, dining and family area, garage...........S 67,000.00
407 S.W. 3rd, LOCKNEY-Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath, great starter home, attached garage, 

central heat, cellar............................... .... $ 38,000.00
618 S. MAIN, LOCKNEY--^ 1 3/4 bath, garage, basement.................................
.......................................................................$ 38.500.00
HOME IN COUNTRY: 3 bedroom home with 43.64 acres, bam. pipe fencing, show animal
facilities. Ilandscapcd. Central h/a. Double garage, on pavenaent. South Plain.....................
........................................................................$ 107,000.00
COUNTRY HOME ON PAVEMENT: 3-1 -2, large family room, dining room, cellar, central 
hcat/air, between Lockney and Floydada.... S 36,000.00

Thank you for reading the Hesperian-Beacon

"APPLICATION FOR
FEDERAL EM PLOYM ENT

FORM #0F 612 WILL BE PROVIDED TO RESIDENTS OF 
HALE, LUBBOCK & SURROUNDING COUNTIES.

•I

YOU MAY NOW REGISTER IN A STATE NATIONAL TRAINING SERVICE PROGRAM TO TRAIN 
^}R FEDERAL & STATE EMPLOYMENT ELIGIBILITY IN LAW ENFORCEMENT & GENERAL CLERICAL

Correctional Officer 
Fingerprint Tech. 
Security/Prison Guard 
Deputy US Marshal 
Customs/lmmigration 
Park Ranger 
IRS/ATF

Fish & Wildlife Adm. 
Police Offlcer/FireFighter 
Social Servica Ass't

i

Motor Vehicle Operator
f

Inspectors 
Computer Operator 
Border Patrol

Communications 
Medical Ass't 
Medical/Legal Clark 
Postal Servica 
Food Service 
Health Aide 
& More

With Starting Pay O f Up To: $ 1 4  - $ 2 0  per hr. 
• GREAT BENEFITS • JOB SECURITY

No Experience Required If you have experience or higher
Government Provides education, you may be eligible
on the Job Training for higher pay ratings

STATE NATIONAL TRAINING SERVICE. INC.
2 HOUR ORIENTATION - $5 FEE

AT. HOLIDAY INN EXPRESS 4005 OLTON RD., PLAINVIEW 
THURSDAY, DECEMBER 10TH 7:00PM ONLY!

Absolutely No Phone Calls or Late Arrivals
Limited Seating Bring Pen Mo Children

Http://www.DanCoWeb.com
http://www.texasonline.net/Adamson
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Grace Fellowship slates 
Christian New Year Jam

Anyone interested in ringing in the 
New Year in a family environment, 
full of music and fun, is invited to 
come and sing along with area musi­
cians at a Christian jam and New 
Year's Eve Party in Cockney's El­
ementary Cafeteria.

The praise party, sponsored by 
Grace Fellowship Church of Cockney, 
will begin at 7:00 p.m., Dec. 31st.

Already lined up for the evening 
are: The Tiilia Fellowship Praise Sing­
ers; Mike Vinyard, of the Trinity 
Church in Amarillo; Ray Perryman, 
of Shallowater, a music evangelist

with Cowboy Ministries;
Ronnie Cm , of Jesus Is The Rock 

Church in Paducah; Randy Miller, of 
the First United Methodist Church in 
Piainview; the Roaring Springs Full 
Gospel Church Praise Team; the Spiri­
tual Soul Seekers of Cubbock; and the 
praise team from the Tempio Poder De 
Ca Alabanza Pentecostes in Cockney.

There is no charge and refreshments 
will be served.

A car show is also tentatively 
planned from 4:00 p.m. - 6:30 p.m. at 
Cockney Elementary.

f

L IG H T H O U S E  M U S IC  M IN IS T R IE S

Trinity Church to host 
Lighthouse Music Ministries

Trinity Church of Floydada will 
host the Lighthouse Music Ministries 
Singers, Sunday, December 13th. It 
will begin at 9:4S a.m. and conclude 
about noon. They will have a variety 
of styles of singing including South­
ern Gospel music.

Frank and Joyce Taylor began their 
Music Ministry in 1959 and travelled 
two years in full time Music Ministry 
Evangelism. Since then, they have 
served the CcM'd as ministers of Mu­
sic, Music Directors and Pastors.

In 1976, they and their children be­
gan traveling on weekends as the 
"CIGHTHOUSE SINGERS." In

1977, they sang on the 700 Club.
Now, still as a family group with 

their daughter Tawnya and son-in-law 
Mahlon, they are still singing for the 
Cord.

Recently, CIGHTHOUSE were 
special guest on Prime Time Christian 
Broadcasting in Midland. God is truly 
blessing in their ministry.

Pastor Henry Russell extends a spe­
cial invitation to each one to be a part 
of this service. About midway through 
the service, a break will give every­
one a chance to meet these singers and 
fellowship for a few minutes. Only a 
love offering will be received.

ft
By: Pastor H enry  Russell

Falling In Love With The Author
A small boy once asked his grandfather, "Grandfather, why do you read the 

Bible so much?" The grandfather replied, "You see, I might say I'm studying 
up for my final exams." There are those that have read the Bible through many 
times, and still love every word it has to say to us.

A young lady once laid down a book she'd just finished, with the remark 
that it was the dullest story she had ever read.

In the course of time she became engaged to a young man. "I have a book in 
my library whose author's name, and even the initials, are precisely the same 
as yours. Isn't that a singular coincidence?"

"I don’t think so...you see I wrote the book," he replied.
That night, the young lady sat up until two o'clock reading the book again. 

And this time it seemed the most interesting story she'd ever read. The once 
dull book was now fascinating...because she knew and now loved the author!

One of the old church hymns that is a favorite of mine is, "I love to tell the 
story..." The last line speaks volumes to those of us that love the author . . .

I love to tell the story, for those that know it best.
Seem hungering and thirsting, to hear it like the rest.
And when, in scenes of glory. I'll sing the new, new song.
Twill be the old, old story, that I have love so long.

The Honeymoon Is Over

By Ron Trusler

By Ron TVussIer
Things Jo not stay the same in a 

marriage relationship. The first feel­
ings of love may be a little different 
than when a couple has lived to to­
gether for awhile. It seems that the 
responsibilities of work, family, 
health, finances begin to change the 
marriage relationship. This realization 
can be disturbing. You may begin to 
wonder if something is wrong in the 
marriage.

Just because feelings may have 
changed on the surface due to other 
responsibilities, it does not mean they 
have changed deep down. It seen^ 
that the "preoccupation" changes. Ih 
the beginning we are preoccupied with 
the other person. Later, other things 
take that place of preoccupation.

Couples who telieve the honey­
moon must last forever are not facing 
the reality of life. They may try so hard 
to place blame for the change that the 
relationship is sabotaged unnecessar­
ily. Wading through the "junk" of life 
can actually deepen a relationship.

True love is more than warm fuzzy 
feelings. It involves dedication, com­
mitment, and faithfulness. In one 
sense, being taken for granted can be 
a compliment. It shows that you are 
trusted and dependable.

There are times the warm-fuzzy 
feelings need to be refreshed. We need 
to be reminded of the things that at­
tracted us to the other person to begin 
with. That needs to be worked at quite 
often in a relationship. How do you 
do that? Take some time away, on a 
regular basis, from the various respon­
sibilities you have and be alone with 
your partner. You don't have to do 
anything fancy. It may be a drive, a 
picnic, a nobby, a walk-whatever will 
allow you to sort of touch base with 
each other again.

Remember, the way we express our 
emotions may change over time. That 
doesn't mean the emotions have 
changed.

(0M» TrmMirr 1$ ExtttUlv* IMrfCtor • /  Cm - 
I'laiM MIIM0 m i Smkilamet Aktue Cm-

1 f/« aMjr rwaelHi ml 90t.2f3-2t3«.)

Save Money Off Your Newsstand cost- 
Get a Subscription

In  County (Yearly) ••••••••••*•*•••************************************* $16.00
Includes Floyd, Swisher, H ale , M otley, Briscoe and Crosby Counties 

O th er Counties,-,.—,,-,—*-..-.—-.—•••••••••••••♦—
O n t o f State.. ,.$19.00

Senior Citiaenf may deduct $1.00 for their own personel robscrlption

"^loyd C ountu Chut^chPir’ectotH
AIKEN BAPTIST CHURCH 

Henry Martin, Pastor
Sunday School.............10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.........11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship...........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:
Bible Study................... 7:30 p.m.

mm*
BETHANY BAPTIST CHURCH 

607 W. Lee S t, Floydada 
J.D. Young, Pastor

Sunday School. . . . . .  .10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship..........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening

Prayer Meeting...........7:00 p.m.
m m *

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
810 S. 3rd, Floydada 

Darwin Robinson, Pastor
Sunday:

Sunday School...........10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  10:45 a.m.
Prayer Meeting...........6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship___  6:30 p.m.

Wednesday:
Evening Services___ 7:30 p.m.

*****
CALVARY 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Glen IVuitt, Pastor
Sunday School.............9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  11:00 a.m.
Bible Study.....................6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship.........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening . .  7:00 p.m 

*****
CARR’S CHAPEL

Service Every Sunday: 
Morning Worship. . .  9:00 a.m.
Sunday School___ 10:30 a.m.

*****
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
West College & Third, 

Lockney
Frank Duckworth, Evangelist
Morning Worship . . .  10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship . . . .  5:30 p.m.
Wednesday Service . .  .8:00 p.m. 

*****
CITY PARK 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Floydada

Gene McCarty, Minister
Sunday:

Bible Study...............9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship . . .  10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship . . . .  6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday:
Bible Study...............7:30 p.m.
(Summer................. 8:00 p.m.)

*****
EVANS CHAPEL 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. G.A. Blocker

Sunday School.............10:00 a.m.
doming Worship . . . . ,  11:00 a.m.
Afternoon Worship.........2:00 p.m.

raining U nion .............. 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship............ 7:00 p.m.

Wednesday:
Prayer Meeting............ 7:00 p.m.

*****
FIRST ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD CHURCH 

701 W. Missouri, Floydada 
Vance Mitchell, Pastor

Sunday School........................ 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.......... 10:50 a.m.
Sunday Evening

Evangelistic.........................6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Night Service.............. 7:00 p.m.
*****

n R S T  BAPTIST CHURCH 
401 S. Main, Floydada 

Anthony D. Sisemore, Pastor 
Michael Holster 

Music/Adm-/Sr. Adults 
Lcs Reed, Interim Youth Dir. 

Sunday:
Instrumental Ensemble. . .  8:30 a.m. 
Church-wide Pre-Sunday School

Fellowship...................... 9:00 a.m.
Sunday School.............9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  10:45 a.m

Celestial Ringers.............4:45 p.m.
Discipleship Training, Nursery, Mis­
sion Friends, Team Kid, Bible Drill, 
Youth Drama and Adult Bible
Study................................ 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship...........6:00 p.m.

Wednesday:
Children's Choir...............4:00 p.m.
Evening Meal.................. 6:00 p.m.
Prayer Time t All Ages). . .  6:30 p.m. 
Nursery, Preschool Choir, RA's, 
GA's Sanctuary Choir,Youth Bible 
Study, Adult Bible Study.. 7:00 p.m.
Sanctuary Choir.............7:00 p.m.

*****
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Lockney
Harold Abney, Pastor 

Phil Cotham, Director of Music 
Debbie Wiley, Youth Minister

Sunday:
Sunday School........... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  10:45 a.m.
Youth..............................7:00 p.m

Evening Worship........... 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:
Prayer Meeting........... 7:00 p.m.
Youth Bible Study........ 7:00 p.m.
Adult C hoir............................. 8:00 p.m.

*****
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 

Reverend lone Sedinger 
Pastor

Sunday School.................9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship..........  11:00 a.m.

*****
FIRST UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Wendell Horn, Pastor
Sunday School.............. 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship . . . .  11:00 a.m.
Youth Fellowship.......... 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship.......... 6:00 p.m.

*****
FIRST UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
Lockney

Russ Byard, Pastor
Sunday School....................... 9:15 a.m.
Worship Service......... 10:30 a.m.
UM Y........................................ 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship.............6:00 p.m.
United Methodist Women,
Hill Circle, 3rd Tues.. . .  9:30 a.m. 
Ruth Wesley Circle:
2nd & 4th Mondays . . .  10:30 a.m.

FRIENDSHIP CHAPEL CME 
Floydada

Rev. James Jenkins
Sunday.................................... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Service.........11:00 a.m.
Wednesday:

Bible Study.......................8:00 p.m.
*****

GRACE FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 
211 N. Main, Lockney 

Interdenominational Church 
Rev. Farril De Foor, Pastor

Sunday School.........................9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship...........11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship............ 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service.........7:00 p.m.

Christian Counseling Available 
*****

GRANT CHAPEL CHURCH 
OF GOD IN CHRIST 
John WUliams, Pastor

Sunday School.............10:00 a.m..
Monday Worship............ 11:00 a.m..
Evening Service...............7:30 p.m..
Tuesday:

Prayer Service............... 8:00 p.m.-
Wednesday Service.......... 7:30 p.m.-

*****
POWER OF PRAISE 

FULL GOSPEL CHURCH 
404 E. 6th S t, Lockney 

Lupe Banda, Pastor
Sunday School.............10:00 a.m.
Evening Service.............. 6:00 p.m.
Tuesday:

Youth Service............... 7:30 p.m.
Friday:

Youth Service............... 7:00 p.m.
*****

MAIN STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Lockney
Russell Harris, Minister

Bible Study.....................9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship........ 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship..............6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Ladies Bible Class..........9:30 a.m.
Bible Study................. 7:30 p.m.

*****
MT. ZION 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Ralph Jackson
Sunday School............. 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.......... 11:00 a.m.
BTU.................................. 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship............ 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Mid-Week Prayer........ 7:00 p.m.
Thursday:

Bible Study...................7:00 p.m.
*****

NEW SALEM PRIMITIVE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Sunday: Congregational

Singing.......................10:30 a.m.
Morning Worship.......... 11:00 a.m.

3rd Sunday, Elder Don Martin
4th Sunday, Tom Taylor 

*****
PRIMER IGLESIA 

BAUTISTA 
Lockney

Pedro Villareal, Pastor
Sunday School..................9:45 a.m.
Worship Service.......... 11:00 a.m.
Training U nion ................5:00 p.m.
Evening Service...............6:00 p,fn>
Wednesday Service.........7:30 p.M.
G.A.’s ................................... 7:30 p.m.
Ambassadors....................... 7:30 p.m.
Fellowship Luncheon - 

1 st Sunday of Month;
Music Worship;
Last Sunday with evening service 

*****
PRIMERA IGLESIA BAUTISTA 

Floydada 
Rev. Lupe Rando

Sunday School.................... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship............10:55 a.m.
Evening Worship.............6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening___ 7:00 p.m.

*****
SAN JOSE

CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Lockney

Msgr. Tim Schwertner, Pastor
Wednesday:
Communion Service . . .  8:00 p.m.
Sunday M a ss.............11:30 a.m.

*****

Tfus page is brovght to you 6y tfie fottoxving sponsors:
Barwise Gin

Barwise Community 
983-2737

Goen & Goen 
Insurance

102 E. California 983-3524

Oden
Chevrolet-Olds

221S. Main-Hoydada-983-3787

Cargill
Hybrid Seeds

652-3339, Aiken

Floyd County 
Hesperian-Beacon

111 E. Missouri, Floydada - 983-3737 
120S. Main. Lockney - 652-3318

Pay-n-Save
210N.Main-Lockney 

652-2293

City Auto
201E. Missouri - Floydada 

983-3767

Lighthouse 
Electric Coop

Floydada- 983-2184

Payne Family 
Pharmacy

200 S. Main, Floydada, 983-5111

Clark Pharmacy
320 N. Main - Lockney 

652-3353

Lockney 
Co-op Gin
Lockney - 652-3377

Schacht
Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts
112 W. Poplar. Lockney. 652-2385

Davis Lumber
102 E. Shurbet - Lockney 

652-3385

Lockney 
ins. Agency

105 N. Main - Lockney - 652-3347

Sunshine Pump
O live r Clark 

Box 266, Lockney, Tx. 79241 
652-3792 Mobile 774-4412

SOUTH PLAINS
b a p t i s t  c h u r c h

Ernest Stewnrt, Peitor
Sunday School............10:W a.m.
Morning Worship. . .  . 1 l:iX) a.m 

* * •••
SPANISH ASSEMBLY 

OFGODTEMPLO  
GETSEMANI 
308 Mississippi 

Rev. Alejandro Ruiz Jr. 
983-2864 or 983-5286

Sunday School...........10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship-----11:00 a.m.
Evening Evangelistic

Service......................6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:
Family N igh t................ 7:30 p.m.

*****
ST. MARY MAGDALEN 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Floydada 
Father John Ollg 

Deacon Ricky Vasquez
Sunday M a ss...............11:30 a.m.
Tuesday M a ss ............... 6:30 p.m.
Wednesday M ass........... 6:30 p.m.
Rosary recited 1/2 hour before each Mass

Phone: 983-5878 
*****

TEMPLO BAUTISTA SALEM 
Lockney

Pedro Reyes, Interim Pastor
Sunday Sch ool.............. 9:45 p.m.
Worship Service...........11:00 a.m.
Christian Training-----5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship......... 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:
Prayer M eeting............7:30 p.m.

*****
TEMPLO BETHEL 

SPANISH ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD

Washington and 1st S t  
Lockney 652-2181

Gabriel W. Ortiz, Pastor 
Olga L. Martinez, Youth Pastor

Sunday School............. 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.........II :00 a.m.
Evening Worship........... 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service . . . .  7:30 p.m. 

*****
TEMPLO EVANGELICO 

PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
515 E. Missouri, Floydada

Sunday School............9:45 a.m.
Evening Worship......... 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service . . .  7:00 p.m. 

*****
TEMPLO LIBERTAD 
203 SE 2nd, Lockney 

. 652-2793
Pastor Juan A. Guttemss

Wednesday Evening . . 7:30 p.m. 
Sunday School...........10:00 a.m.
Sunday Worship.......... 5:00 p.m.

*****
TEMPLO NUEVA VIDA 

Rev. Herman Martinez 
308 W. Tennessee, Floydada

Sunday School.............10:00 a.m.
Prayer Service............ 2:00 p.m.

Evening Worship............. 5:00 p.m.
Tuesday:

Evening Service..........7:30 p.m.
Thursday Service............ 7:30 p.m.

*****
TEMPLO PODER 

DE LA ALABANZA 
PENTECOSTES 

Rev. Manuel Rendon, Pastor 
704 N. Main, Lockney 

652-3704
Sunday Services.........10:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening...........5:00 p.m.
Wednesday..................... 7:30 p.m.

TRINITY CHURCH 
500 W. Houston Floydada 
Interdenominational Church 

Henry Russell, Pastor 
983-5499

Sunday School.............9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship___ 10:40 a.m.
Sunday Evening...........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday....................7:00 p.m.
4th Sunday Singing . . .  6:00 p.m 

*****
TRINITY

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Providence Community 
on FM 2301 293-3009

Interim Pastor • Melinda Morton
Sunday School &

Adult Bible Class.. . .  10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service'.. . .  11:00 a.m.

WEST SIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Floydada 983-3548

Sunday Worship.......... 10:30 a.m.
Sunday Evening.............6:00 p.m.
Wednesday...................... 7:00 p.m.

Garcia's
OK Tire Store

308 S. Main-Floydada-983-3370 
511 1st.-Olton,Tx.-285-7796

Moore-Rose-White
Funeral Home

329 W. Calif., Floydada, 983-2525 
402 S. Main, Lockney, 652-2211

M xnd tfie Cfiurcfi 
of youT efioke on Sunday,

- T-1-rnr’ jnnwrwifli~ ~


