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M OSLEY M AKES ACCEPTANCE S PE E C H -Johnnie  Mosley makes 
his acceptance speech a fte r being elected president of the National Fu­
tu re  Hom em akers of Am erica during  the 1996 Leadership M eeting held 
in S t  Louis, M issouri. Photo by Lisa Mosley

Democratic Executive Committee 
names General Election candidate

By Ju an ita  Stepp
Ray Nell Bearden has been se­

lected as the candidate for Precinct 1 
Commissioner who will appear on 
the November General Election bal­
lot. Bearden was recently appointed 
as Floyd County Commissioner for 
Precinct 1 following the unexpected 
death of her husband, Commissioner 
Connie Bearden.

According to Floyd County Judge 
Bill Hardin, Section 145.036 of the 
State Election Code allows the local 
Executive Committee to select a re­
placement candidate if  a name is 
removed from the ballot due to a 
death on or before 65 days prior to 
election day. W rite-in candidates 
would also be eligible for election in 
N ovem ber by filing with Floyd 
County Clerk Margaret Collier prior 
to the first week in September.

L lo yd  w in s  s ta te  
proficiency aw ard

FLOYDADA - Stacey Lloyd, a 
member of the Floydada FFA Chap­
ter, was named the State FFA Fiber 
Crop Production-Entrepreneurship/ 
Placement Proficiency winner and 
received a $100 check at the State 
FFA convention.

National finalists will each receive 
a plaque, a $250 check and travel ex­
penses to the 69th National FFA con­
vention in Kansas City, Mo., in No­
vember. The national winner will be 
selected from this group, and will 
receive an additional plaque, a $250 
check and an invitation to participate 
in the International Travel Seminar.

The Fiber Crop Production - En- 
treprencurship/Placement Proficiency 
award program recognizes outstand­
ing FFA members for their ability to 
efficiently produce and market fiber 
crops such as cotton and sisal. It is 
one of 40 national award areas that 
recognize FFA members for achieve­
ment in activities leading to careers 
in agriculture.

FFA is a national organization of 
444,497 members preparing for lead­
ership and careers in the science, busi­
ness and technology of agriculture. 
The organization has 7,264 local 
chap ters  located th roughout the 
United States, Puerto Rico, Guam and 
the Virgin Islands. FFA's mission is

Mosley named national FHA president

Connie Bearden, the sitting com­
missioner, won theDemocratic nomi­
nation in the March Primary Election.

Jeffrey Johnson, Floyd County 
Democratic Party Chairman, told the 
H esperian-Beacon that the local 
Executive Committee met July 10 
and chose Bearden’s widow as the 
party’s candidate to appear on the 
printed ballot for the November 5 
General Election.

"The committee wanted a sense of 
continuity and we all felt that Ray 
Nell was well qualified and knew the 
workings of the Precinct," stated 
Johnson. "We are confident that she 
will serve the people of Precinct 1 and 
Floyd County very well."

The local Executive Committee is 
made up of the eleven Precinct Chair­
men in Floyd County.

By Neta M arble
LCXTKNEY—^Johnnie Mosley was 

elected 1996-97 President of the Fu­
ture Homemakers of America (FHA/ 
HERO) organization. He was one of 
10 officers elected during the 1996 
Leadership Meeting. The convention 
was held July 7-11 in St. Louis, Mis­
souri.

Attending along with Mosley were 
Texas D elegate , R ita M ann of 
Lockney; Treena Aston and Julie 
Ellison Lockney High School FHA/ 
HERO Advisors; his parents Ricky 
and Lisa Mosley and his grandmother, 
Jackie Gregory of Floydada.

Mosley is a senior at Lockney High 
School and has been a member o f the 
Lockney FHA/HERO chapter for 
three years. During that time he has 
served as President and as Vice Presi­
dent of Programs in the local chapter. 
He has served as Texas Region I Vice 
President of Programs and last year as 
State Parliamentarian.

“When they announced that I had 
been elected president it was almost 
like a dream. I asked myself ‘Is it re­
ally true?’ and I still am not totally 
sure. I do know when I start traveling 
that it will really hit m e,” stated 
Mosley.

M osley is the first Texan to be 
elected to a national office in the or­
gan ization . A nother Texan, Beth 
Cochran o f Lubbock, was elected to 
serve as vice president. “It was an ac­
cident that two Texans were elected 
officers. We will attend a few meet­
ings together but mostly we will travel 
to different areas," Mosley stated.

According to Lisa Mosley "We did 
not know that Johnnie had been se­
lected as president until they were an­
nouncing the new officers. “He had

Salute to 80 years of Vaudeville
Support the Friends of Floyd County ♦ 

and the Multi-Purpose building.
Get your tickets now for a night of 

exciting family entertainment. 
Benefit Variety Show-~August 17,1996

been acting kind of glum and we de­
cided that he had not gotten an office 
he wanted. It was only when we could 
see he was last in line to be introduced 
that we knew he was to be president," 
stated Lisa.

She continued, “It was just incred­
ible. As they were announcing the 
officers the 250 member Texas delega­
tion began to rumble and when they 
realized that the only two offices left 
were going to Texans they nearly 
drowned out the announcements.”

There were 41 candidates for the ten 
offices. The voting delegates at the 
convention narrow ed the num ber 
down to ten and the actual officers 
were selected by the National Coun­
cil.

Mosley stated that the members of 
the National Council voted five times 
before the tie between him and an­
other delegate was broken and he was 
named president.

He was elected to a two year term. 
The first year he will serve as presi­
dent and the second year he will be a 
member of the National Board of Di­
rectors.

“We are so excited! Election as a 
national officer is the highest leader­
ship honor an FHA/HERO member 
can receive,” stated Lockney High 
School Advisor Treena Aston. “This 
can open so m any avenues for 
Johnnie.”

The election took place during a 
four-day leadership event centered 
around the student-developed theme 
“Imagine the Possibilities.”

“The theme was developed to in­
spire youth to imagine the endless 
possibilities we can attain by gaining 
“life skills” through our involvement 
in FHA/HERO. Members are encour­

aged to develop leadership skills, 
strengthen family values and increase 
com m unity involvem ent,” stated 
Mosley.

“I have challenged the 240,000 
members to, as the song goes, “Each 
One Reach One”. If each member 
asks a friend to be a member we could 
double the membership,” he contin­
ued.

During the week, more than 4,200 
young men and women and their ad­
visers from all 50 states, the District 
of Columbia, Puerto Rico and the 
Virgin Islands attended workshops 
and sessions on relevant teen issues 
such as teen violence, the effect of the 
media on teen image, fitness and nu­
trition, traffic safety, environmental 
awareness, family relations and future 
careers.

In addition, members were encour­
aged to develop leadership skills, 
strengthen family values and increase 
com m unity involvem ent through 
workshops and panel discussion pre­
sented by youth and adults.

Mosley related that he will travel 
several times during the year with the 
other nine officers to Reston, Virginia 
to attend program planning sessions 
at the organization’s national leader­
ship center.

“I will help set policies and develop 
future goals for the organization as a 
board of director committee member.
I will get to travel all over the United 
States and represent the organization 
by leading workshops and making 
speechs.

“One thing I am looking forward 
to is the 1997 national leadership 
meeting. I will get to help plan the 
focus of the program and preside over 
the meeting. The meeting will be held

in San Diego, California in July,” he 
said.

The "Youth At Its Best" award was 
presented to the Texas delegation by 
the hotel, restaurant and convention 
personnel. The award is given to the 
delegation that makes the best im­
pression during their stay. Sharon 
Pierce, Texas Advisor from Austin, 
accepted the plaque for the group.

Future Homemakers of America is 
a national student organization that 
helps young men and women become 
leaders and address important per­
sonal, family, work and social issues 
through family and consumer sci­
ences education.

It is the only in-school organiza­
tion with the family as its central fo­
cus. The o rgan iza tion  o p era tes  
through a nationwide netw ork of 
more than 9,(XX) local chapters and 
53 state orgnizations with a total 
membership of more than 240,(X)0 —  
19 percent of which is male.

Since its founding in 1945, more 
than nine million students have par­
ticipated  in FH A /H ER O . Future  
Homemakers of America is unique 
among youth organizations because 
its programs are planned and run by 
members. Participation in national 
programs and chapter activities helps 
members become strong leaders in 
their families, careers and communi­
ties.

Mosley ended, “By the time my 
term is over I would like to see the 
male/female ratio closer to equal. 
FHA/HERO is more about leader­
ship, the family, the community and 
life skills than it is the cooking and 
sewing that people think it is. It is so 
much more.”

The tregedies of terrorism

STACEY LLOYD

to make a fiositive difference in the 
lives of students by developing their 
potential for premier leadership, per­
sonal growth and career success 
through agricultural education. Local, 
state and national activities and award 
programs provide opportunities for 
students to apply knowledge and 
skills learned in the classroom.

Stacey is the daughter of Steve and 
Judy Lloyd and the granddaughter of 
Louis and Janice Lloyd and E.O. and 
Juanita Chappel, all of Floydada.

By Cindy Perez
At least 19 American soldiers lost 

their lives in the bombing at the U.S. 
Air Force complex in Dhahran, Saudi 
Arabia. The Tuesday, June 25, bomb­
ing injured more than 300 other 
people including some of Saudi's 
own.

The terror of the bombing was 
great. Families lost fathers, parents 
lost sons, and in the case of my fam­
ily we lost a good friend.

My family has been a military fam­
ily ever since my oldest brother, 
Efren, joined the military in January 
of 1989. He was in the Air Force, as­
signed to be a crew chief for a period 
of four years.

My second brother, J.J. followed 
that August, signing a four year term 
with the Air Force as a fuel systems 
specialist.

They both served in the Persian 
Gulf War and returned home safely 
within the year after the war. I, and 
my parents for that matter, thought we 
were out of the dark of losing some­
one close to us. We were wrong.

In November of 1995 my oldest 
brother, who had already served his 
four year term and was finishing up 
his second term, called my parents 
and was contemplating the idea of re­
enlisting for a third time.

Efren had been stationed at Eglin 
Air Force Base, Florida for the past 
five years. He was living off-base 
with a good friend and fellow service­
m an, Tech Sargeant Daniel Ben 
Cafourek.

He was going on and on about hav­
ing to serve overseas again if he re­
enlisted. Efren had already lived in 
the Netherlands for a year and a half 
before serving a year in Turkey dur­
ing the war.

All the while, his roommate, Dan, 
was preparing his life for his TDY 
(temporary duty) in Saudi. He was 
leaving in March and would be back 
in June. He was only supposed to be 
gone three months.

The bombing, June 25, happened 
two days before Dan's unit (and the 
unit my brother used to work with) 
deployed from Saudi. Dan's arrival 
date in the U.S. was June 27. A mere 
48 hours later.

When I heard about the bombing I 
was saddened, but relieved. A year 
ago my brother was there, doing a 
TDY just like Dan was.

That Tuesday night, I was on the

phone with a friend about 10 p.m. 
when the line beeped...it was my 
brother. After hanging up I asked the 
usual question "What's going on?"

On the line was a nervous shaky 
voice, "Did you hear about the bomlv 
ing — Cindy — Dan's over there. "

My heart sunk. I got a lump in my 
throat and said, "I'll let you talk to 
Daddy." I told my father Efren was 
on the phone and hung up. I laid in 
bed, frozen, and waited for Daddy to 
hang up.

I laid there thinking what could 
have happened to Dan while trying 
to convince myself to think positively. 
"Dan was okay. He was going to cadi 
my brother any minute. He was alive 
and okay."

Dan was my brother's best friend. 
He had met Dan when he first moved 
to Florida in September of 1991.

They had a lot in common, they 
both loved racing cars and went to the 
races often. Both of them drove same 
year model Ford Mustangs and both 
were crew chiefs in the Air Force. Dan 
was a Techincal Sargeant, Efren was 
a Staff Sargeant.

My brother served seven years and 
Dan had served 13 years and re-en­
listed in July of 1995 for another four 
years.

When my father hung up that night, 
he said that things in Saudi from what 
Efren knew were pretty bad. He had

heard that the building that Dan was 
living in was almost completely de­
stroyed by the bomb and there was 
nothing more than a big hole in the 
ground from where the bomb ex­
ploded. As of then (Tuesday night our 
time, six were confirmed dead and 
Dan wasn't one of them.)

The next day was extremely long. 
When I got home from work my 
whole family was already home and 
we watched the news to hear of any 
more confirmed deaths and who they 
were. Tears formed in my eyes as I 
saw the building almost demolished 
by the bomb and the crater (35 feet 
deep and 85 feet across) the bomb had 
created. Efren didn’t call that night. 
"No news is good news," I thought.

I went to work the next day and 
ended up going home early. When I 
walked into my house on that Thurs­
day afternoon I heard the phone hang­
up and saw my mom's face with tears 
streaming down it. It was that moment 
I knew.

Dan was unaccounted for, however, 
six bodies were still unidentified and 
were waiting on DNA tests to con­
firm their identities. Efren was almost 
sure that Dan was one of them.

He said, "Mom, I went to the base 
today and saw all those guys getting 
off the plane from Saudi. They were 
all my friends. Mom, Dan should 
have been on that plane. It was so hard

seeing all those guys get off the plane, 
and knowing that Dan wasn't one of 
them."

My mom could barely speak, with 
tears rolling down my face and hers 
we just sat in silence for a few min­
utes. I was scared. I kept thinking, "If 
1 was having this hard a time with a 
friend dying in the bombing how in 
the world were those who had sons, 
father, and husbands killed feeling?"

That night as we told my other 
brother, David and my father when 
they got home what Efren had said, a 
little bit died in each of us. Not only- 
for Dan but for the other 19 soldiers 
who had probably been doing the 
same thing Dan was doing. (At the 
time of Dan's death, he was assumed 
to be in his room packing his stuff to 
come home.)

A little bit of faith died in me. Faith 
in the American military and the se­
curity steps taken to protect our sol­
diers who are out protecting our coun­
try and its interests.

Freedom is wonderful but it isn't 
free. Those 19 lives taken by the 
bombing are only the beginning. Each 
one of those soliders lives is irreplace­
able. Dan was one of them. He died 
for the country that he loved, not by 
choice, but because it was his job, and 
he was working to make things bet­
ter here for you and me. Think about 
that.

- \ \
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DAN CA FOU REK and EFREN PER EZ JR .
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RETURNING TO JA IL  -  Flanked by Floyd County 
Deputy Sheriff Jon W hite, left, and Cockney Police 
Chief Je rry  Edw ards, right, Salvador Ascencio is re-

B> Alice Gilroy
Salvador Ascencio. 29, of laKkney, 

was convicted tr) 16 years in prison 
hy llO tli D istric t Judge Randy 
Holluins, Wednesday, July !(), after 
he pled guilty to the offense of De­
livery of Cocaine.

.Ascencio pled guilty before the 
judge and requested sentencing by 
the judge instead of a jury. Defense 
Attorney Enrique Martine/, argued 
for probation and said Ascencio had 
nut been in any trouble since his July 
1,:, 1994 arrest for selling cocaine to 
an undercover officer in Cockney.

Ascencio's wife and brother-in-law 
also testified to Ascencio's character 
and both stated they believed he had 
changed and could abide by the terms

of probation.
Martinez, also argued to Judge 

Hollums that even though Ascencio 
had lived in I loyd County since he 
was 9 years old, he was not a U.S. 
Citizen and by terms of a new federal 
law if he was not given probation 
Ascencio would automatically be de­
ported after .serving a prison sentence.

A.scencio has three children ages, 
9, 6 and 5.

Floyd County Prosecutor Becky 
McPherson called cx-Lockney Police 
Chief Lcnnie Gilroy to the stand and 
asked him if Ascencio had a bad repu­
tation in Lockney. Gilroy told the 
court, "Salvador Ascencio has a repu­
tation in laK'kney for being a drug 
dealer--which is what he is--so 1

would consider that a bad reputation."
Lockney Police C h ie f Jerry 

Edwards also testified that Ascencio 
had a "bad reputation" in Lockney.

In closing arguments McPherson 
told Hollums that Salvador Ascencio 
lived beyond his means (he is a sea­
sonal farm laborer and his wife works 
in a clothing store) and she felt the 
evidence proved he sold drugs to sup­
port his lifestyle.

McPherson asked for a "hefty sen­
tence".

Ascencio faced a sentence of 5 -9 9  
years, or life in prison and a $ 10,(X)0 
fine. Hollums sentenced Ascencio to 
16 years in prison and a $5,000 fine. 
A fter his prison  term  is served 
Ascencio will be deported to Mexico.

By Juan ita  .Stepp
l l.OYD AD A — M embers of 

C'aprock Hospital District’s Bo.ird of 
i rustccs voted to commit S 12,5(H).00 
tuward the purchase of a Life-Pac 12 
lead heart monitor for the Floyd.ida 
F.MS ambulance during a regular 
session on July 16 Motion for the 
.iction was made by Rob Heflin ami 
seconded by Lee Battey. The vote 
was unanimously in favor of the 
motion.

FMS Board member Kyle Smith 
presented the request after telling 
b'-Hird members grants for the pur- 
‘ hasc were unavailable at this time, 
lie also indicated the special cardiac 
monitor might be purchased through 
the buying network of U.MC’. saving 
between $.4.()()().00 and $4.0(M).00 
|: )in the usual $16.(MK).(K) price tag.

The monitor will replace the cur­
rently used one lead model and enable 
paramedu s to better determine the 
treatment and method of transporta- z 
turn for cardiac patients served by 
F.MS. The equipment would remain 
the property of CUD, as is the ambu­
lance FMS uses to transport patients.

Minutes of the June meeting were 
reviewed and accepted as presented 
■on a motion by Carmel Eastham with 
a second by Heflin. All voted in favor.

CPA Fred lliayer presented the 
monthly financial reports, showing 
the district has $412.81.1.49 in bank 
accounts as of June .10. Tax collec­
tions totaling $311,591.00 for the 
current year are falling below budget 
estimations of $488,464.23. lliis is 
apparently the result of locking m 
budget figures before opting to re­
duce the tax rate last year.

To date in the 1995-96 fi.scal year, 
:;HD revenues total $418,164.24 and 
expenses paid out have been 
$202,793.86. Income has exceeded 
expenditures by $215,370.38 accord­
ing to Fhayer’s reports.

There was no representative pres­
ent for the session, so no update was 
given. Bob Ericson, Clinic Manager.

told the board the only item he knew 
of to report in the absence of a UMC 
representative was the visit last week 
by a potential physician.

Ericson said the physician is a DO, 
not an MD and tentatively plans to 
live in Lubbock if he comes to work at 
Cogdell Clinic m Floydada. He is 
around 60 years .ild and has been 
practicing general medicine intermit­
tently for the past few years. His

N eed H ouse 
Insurance?

We have several companies wanting to write your 
homeowners insurance. Our companies offer sta­
bility and competitive rates, and you can deal with 
an agency which has been in Floydada since 1926.

— Come in for a quote—

GOEN & GOEN
102 E. California, Floydada 806-983-3524

Thank You!
to these farmers who have donated

’ HARVEST POINTS”
to the Multi-Purpose Building

Warren Mitchell 
Ros.s Farms 
Yeary Farms 
Weldon Pruitt 
Carthel Bros. 
Applinj; Farms 
Foster Bros. Farms 
.loci Hendrix 
Travis .Jones 
Nathan .Johnson

J^arry Adrian 
Tom Johnson 
James Cage 
Keith Phillips 
J.R. Idrner  
Rick HeHin 
Beedy Farms 
Mike Mathis 
(iene McJ>ain 
Kenneth Wofford

If you use PROWL® or THIMET® chemicals on your 
farm, you have HARVEST POINTS, and your HARVEST 
POINTS can help the Floyd County Friends with the Multi- 
Purpose Building Project. Call Tim Mitchell or Shawnda

Foster in Lockney - Nick 
Long or Jon LaBaume in 
Floydada and they will 
give you the 800 number 
to call and get your account 
number and total points. 
T ogether HARVEST 
POINTS could amount to 
a lot, and it will be a dona­
tion that dcjes not come out 
of your pocket I! I

FLOYD
CCIUNTY

C ain seek s e lec tio n  to T exas H o u se  
as rep resen ta tiv e  for  D is tr ic t  85

tu rned  to the Floyd County Jail following conviction 
and sentencing on a charge of Delivery of Cocaine.

”  S taff Photo

D r u g  d e a le r  d r a w s  p r is o n  t e r m

Hollis Cain, candidate for the Dis­
trict 85 Texas House of Representa­
tives seal, will host a homemade ice 
cream supper from 6:30-8:30 p.m. on 
Thursday, July 25, at the home of the 
Probascos, 909 West Georgia St., in 
Floydada. While the casual, come- 
and-go event is free of charge and 
open to the public, donations will be 
accepted.

Cain, a Republican, is a Lamb 
County rancher and businessman. He 
has lived in the Springlake-Earlh 
community since 1965. After fann­
ing for 17 years, he worked in bank­
ing and insurance. He also owned and 
operated an auto parts store before 
returning to ranching full-tim e in 
1989, Cain is a 1971 graduate of 
Texas Christian University’s selective 
Ranch Management School.

Cain’s previous public service in­
cludes nine years on the Springlake- 
Earth School Board. Gov. George W. 
Bush appointed Cain last year to serve

on a statewide educational oversight 
committee.

The Earth Chamber of Commerce 
named Cain, his wife, Charlotte, and 
their three daughters as the Outstand­
ing Farm Family in 1981. Cain, a dea­
con and Sunday School teacher at 
First Baptist Church, Springlake, was 
also honored by 4-H with the Spur 
Award for ‘‘outstanding adult leader­
ship.” ‘T ve  spent my entire life in­
vesting in my fam ily,” Cain said. 
“And my concern for them and for 
the families of this district is the only 
reason I entered the race.” Cain said 
the families in the district and state­
wide have been adversely affected by 
legislation, e.specially in the last quar­
ter of a century. Cain said he will cam­
paign on specifically the effect of leg­
islation in the areas of education and 
family income. “All the power has 
been consolidated in Austin,” he said. 
“Parents have less and less say in their 
children’s education, and less discre­

tion in how they spend their money. 
Taxes, especially on property, have 
sky rocketed.”

HOLLIS CAIN

C H D  B o a r d  a p p r o p r ia te s  fu n d s  
to  E M S  for 12 lead  h ea rt m o n ito r

specialty originally was OB-Gyn 
according to Firic.son. Ericson also 
told the board the visiting physician 
indicated a desire to continue to prac­
tice medicine for another three to five 
years.

Attending the 7:00 a.m. session 
were board members Tom Farris, 
Cannel Eastham, Rob Heflin, and 
Lee Battey, Bob Ericson, Joe Stepp, 
and the Hcsperian-Beacon reporter.

$

C o c a -C o la
6  F^ck 12 oz. Cans

HONCHO
Fountain Drink

PLASTIC 99«f 
PLASTIC REFILL 79<f

^  4A OZ.
P A P E R  C U P

AlisiP'S

COMBO MEAL

2 Hot Diggidy |Alj&^$ 
Corn Pô e! & Talbup a o

H O R M EL L IG H T  & LEA N  S L IC E D

H a m  or  T u rk e y
& o z . PK<3.

i

A L L W A Y S  a LOW p r ic e  on f
6HURFINE

32 01  JAR
Omit.(2mr

You’ll find all this and more 
a t your Allsup’s store

Lockney & 
Floydada

TROPICANA ASSORTED

Juices
16 OZ. s a .

Trofxm

5HURFINE
Crispy Rice 
Cereal
15 OZ BOX

$ 0 2 9
A L L S U P 'S

F res h
1 - 1 / 2  L O A F  

1 F O R  O K

2 ^ - 1  2 9
F O K  I

SHURFINE 00(5 FOOD 

20#  B a0,. $ 4 .® ®

5 HURFINE ULTRA POWER 
LAUNDRY DETERGENT

16 LOAD.. ■

5 HURFINE 
BLEACf 

GAL. ^ 9
STAR KISr 

TUNA
3 9 4 ^

LOW PRICES.
GREAT PRODUCTS W  W l  
24 HOURS A DAY

PRICES EFFECTIVE JULY 1 S - 2 4 ,1 9 9 6  OFFER GOOD WHILE SUPPLIE S U ^
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V A UD EVILLE PER FO R M ER S -  Partial cast for 
the NEW  M usical G rays' Stock Com pany which will 
p resent tw o perform ances on August 17 to benefit 
Floyd C ounty  F riends include: (back row, left to 
right) Cliffy T. Clown, Lucie Daniel, Scott Timm s, 
W illiam  J . Lyon (all from  Lubbock), Bill and Dell 
G ray  (F loydada), C harles A ddington (Lubbock), 
M elody an d  Bob B um s (Las Cruces, New Mexico);

(front row) C herri Tim m s (Lubbock), M arlee Plum* 
m er (Post), D onnetta Keltz, Jeanne S aria  (Lubbock), 
Lori B ritton (W olfforth), Tonya M a rr  (Petersburg), 
Jam ie M cG uire (Floydada). Not p ictured, bu t ap* 
pearing w ith the troupe in the Lockney engagement 
are  D arryl L ippe (Lubbock), Ashleigh Decker (Sla­
ton) and Tyler HEIms (Floydada).

— Courtesy Photo

V ariety  show  to feature local ta lent

Business O f The Week
By Cindy Perez
FLO Y D A D A -If you’re driving 

down second street in Floydada and 
all of sudden feel hunger pains, stop 
at Our Place for a good old fashioned 
cheeseburger basket or one of the 
other daily specials.

Our Place, formerly known as 
Tastee Freez was owned by Neil and 
Joy Smith. "The building we are in 
now is the old Tastee Freez building. 
The original Tastee Freez was down 
the block, but it burned down and 
was moved to our present location,” 
said owner Kathy Ross.

Our Place is owned by Kathy and 
her husband Dennis. They have two 
children, Brandi (Ross) ihippin and 
Paul, who occassionally helps out at 
the drive-in.

The Ross' purchased Our Place 
from Danny and Mitzi Nixon in Oc­
tober of 1993.

Full-time employees are JaNae 
Galloway, Dahlia Sanchez, Delia 
Suarez, and Esther Alaniz. A few 
students also help out during the 
summer months, according to Ross.

Our Place serves hamburgers, 
cheeseburgers, salads, sandwiches, 
and has a variety of dinner baskets. 
The menu features lighter side selec­
tions as well as drinks, ice cream, 
floats and frosties.

'  * -it\ It V ^
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O u r Place Drive In owners and operators Dennis and Kathy Ross (I) 
a re  pictured here with a couple of their full time employees E sther 
Alaniz and Dahlia Sanchez.

Our Place offers daily lunch specials The drive-in is open Monday 
Tuesday thru Friday and during the hot thru Thursday 11 a.m. to 9:30 
summer months snowballs in a variety p ni. and Friday and Saturday 
of flavors are available. 11 a-ni. to 10:30 p.m.

H cket sales are underway for "Sa­
lute to 80-Years o f Vaudeville", to be 
presented at Lockney Elementary 
Cafetorium on Saturday, August 17th. 
The comedy-variety show, produced 
by the New M usical Grays' Stock 
Com pany, is sponsored by Floyd 
County Friends to benefit the Multi- 
Purpose Building project.

The New Musical Grays' were or­
ganized by Bill and Dell Gray o f 
Floydada, not only as a tribute to the 
Gray family's show business legacy, 
but also to review repertoire theatre 
and vaudeville in the region's restored 
theatres and opera house. The Origi­
nal Musical Gray's toured the same 
territory in the 1920's and 1930's.

Earlier this year the New Musical 
G ray 's appeared  in A lam ogordo, 
N.M. for the city's New Year's cel­
ebration. They have also done six 
performances in Post at the Garza 
Theatre, a pair o f shows at the Gem 
Theatre in Claude, and just this month 
of July the Grays' have performed at 
the historic Opera House in Anson

and a benefit in Brownfield for the 
Rialto Community Theatre's restora­
tion project.

According to Bill Gray, "Dell and 
I have devoted a great deal of time 
and effort in framing a fun-filled, fam­
ily oriented package which includes 
some o f the area's most versatile en­
tertainment talent. We have been well 
accepted out on the road, and we are 
looking forw ard to bringing our 
troupe to Floyd County. It will be 
Jamie McGuire's and Tyler Helm's 
first appearance before the home 
folks. They are both from Floydada. 
Tonya Marr, from Petersburg, is also 
a part o f our traveling cast that in­
cludes performers from across the 
South Plains."

"We are very pleased to be a part 
of a fund-raiser for the multi-purpose 
building," added Gray. "The Floyd 
County Friends are to be commended 
for their efforts to make such a facil­
ity a reality. It will benefit Floyd 
County in any number o f ways. Con­
certs, theatre-in-the-round and trav­

eling troupes such as ours could cer­
tainly perform in such a facility."

The Lamplighter Inn of Floydada 
has announced special dining hours 
in conjunction with the benefit vari­
ety show. Reservations will be re­
quired and you can obtain more in­
formation by calling the Lamplighter 
Inn. Some of the proceeds from this 
d inner will be donated to Floyd 
County Friends. The Lamplighter Inn 
is supportive of this project plus the 
historic hotel lays claim of Harley 
Sadler, another touring entertainer 40- 
50 years  ago, o f  stay ing  at the 
Lamplighter.

Because of anticipated crowds, two 
performances of the variety show are 
scheduled at 5:00 p.m and 8:00 p.m. 
Tickets are $10.00 each. Advance 
tickets are recommended and they are 
available in Floydada at First National 
Bank, American State Bank, West 
Texas National Bank and State Farm 
Insurance. Ticket outlets in Lockney 
are First National Bank, Schacht's 
Flowers, and D&J Gin.

C o u n ty  p a y s  fo r  ra d io  e q u ip m e n t
By Juan ita  Stepp
Floyd County C om m issioners 

voted to approve payment to South 
Plains Comm unication for radio 
equipment recently installed to facili­
tate inter city radio transmissions. 
The action was taken during a called 
session on Monday, July 15.

Sheriff Royce Gilmore told the 
court new radio equipment was in 
place and working well.

Payment of $13,354.(X) was au­
thorized on a motion by Precinct 4 
Commissioner Jon Jones with a sec­
ond by Precinct 1 Commissioner Ray 
Nell Bearden. All voted in favor.

The amount approved for payment 
includes fees for the maintenance 
agreement and for the service policy 
agreement covering the equipment.

One farm work contract was ap­
proved, #1657 for Jim Byrd by Billie 
Byrd in Precinct 3 to have a road 
graded at a site 25 miles northeast of

Floydada.
Attending the meeting were Judge 

Bill Hardin, Commissioners Ray Nell 
Bearden and Jon Jones, and the

Hesperian-Beacon reporter. Precinct 
2 Commissioner Lennie Gilroy and 
Precinct 3 Commissioner George 
Taylor were not present.

FARM a RANCHOWNERS
You have special needs with your Insurance and I 
we have companies that know how to meel\ 
those needs. Stable companies working with a 
stable agency Is your best comblnatlonfor Farm | 
and Ranchowners Insurance.

Come In for a quote

GOEN & GOEN
102 E. California. Floydada 606-983-3524

OONGRAtulations
Johnnie Mosley 
1996-1997 FHA

National President
We know you will represent us well.

l \

Caprock Industries
• • •

D & J  Gin
• • •

Dairy Queen
• • •

Dan's Auto
• • •

Floyd County Feed & Seed 
Lindan & D'Lyn Morris 

• • •
The Floyd County Hesperlan-Seacon

Main Street Pizza
• • •

Sasket Case
• • •

J & K Insurance
• • •

Dick's Automotive
Cral^ & Julie Ellison 

• • •
Farm Sureau Insurance Co.

Clar, Judy, Spencer & Meredith Schacht
• • •

Davis True Value Hardware & Lumber

Johnnie Moeley, right, aceepte the FHA presidency 
from out-going president, Shawn Vogt of Minnesota.

Church of Christ
West College & Third Street

• • •

Cargill Hybird Seeds
• • •

Lockney Insurance Agency
• • •

Consumer's Fuel Association
• • •

Kelllson Spraying & Fertilizing
• • •

Schacht Flowers Jewelry & G ifts
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f l o y d  C o u if ty  
L i f e s ty le s

Recipe of the Week

/
Q Lockney Senior Citizens J

'V, BB.. ^

SHANNON COLE WINN and SPRING LIPHAM

Lipham and Winn
Mr. and Mrs. Julian Lipham of Floydada and Mr. and Mrs. Lotus Winn of 

Lubbock announce the engagement of their children Spring Lipham to Shan­
non Cole Winn.

The couple will exchange vows Saturday, September 7. 1996 at Northside 
Baptist Church in Corsicana.

Lipham is a 1993 graduate of Hoydada High School and is employed with 
Thomberg Insurance in Corsicana.

Winn is a 1986 graduate of Lorenzo High School and attended South Plains 
College. He has been an orthotic and prosthetic technician for eight years, 
and is employed with Meyers and Associates Orthotics and Prosthetics in 
Corsicana.

Class of '52 holds reunion

By Gladys Ragle
We had a very good meeting Thurs­

day night, July 11. There were 51 in 
attendance.

We were very glad to have Thelma 
O ’Brien nd her daughter Loy with us 
for a visit.

On Thursday night July 18 we will 
be fortunate to have Traci Beedy to 
give us a program. She was a mission­
ary to Brazil for over five years and 
her program will be about that coun­
try. She has some slides to show along 
with her talk about Brazil.

We hope each of our ailing ones are 
improving and will be able to be back 
with us soon.

Here are some thoughts I ran across 
in a book I have and I thought every­
one might enjoy them.

"This is the day which the Lord has 
made; let us rejoice and be glad in it. 
Psalms 118:24. Everyday is a fresh 
beginning. Everyday is the world 
made new.

Be thankful for the beauty of the 
morning, that you have eyes to see it 
and the faculty to enjoy it. As the day 
advances, forget not to be grateful over 
the small joys as well as the large ones 
- the new flower, the book, the letter, 
the meeting with friends, the kindly 
word. Be thankful for knowledge, for 
the lessons that come through mis­
takes and misfortunes."

MENU 
July  22-26

Monday; Salisbury Steak, veg­
etables, salad, dessert 

Tuesday: Baked ch icken , veg­
etables, salad, dessert 

Wednesday: Chicken fried steak, 
vegetables, salad, dessert 

Thursday: German sausage, veg­
etables, salad, dessert 

Friday; Roast, vegetables, salad, 
dessert

Meals are served with tea, coffee 
and rolls.

This recipe was sent in by M rs. A ubria K ent of Lockney. 
Looks delicious!

Broccoli Salad

4 cups broccoli
2 cups seedless red grapes cut in halves
1 m ^ .  size purple onion (chopped fine)
12 slices bacon cooked crisp, crumbled — or Bacon Bits 
1/2 cup sunflower seeds
(Add bacon crumbs and sunflower seeds just before serving)

D r^ s in g
3/4 cup Miracle Whip
1/4 cup red wine vinegar ,
2 teaspoons sugar
Mix well and pour over salad just before serving.

HALE'S DEPARTMENT STORE
Starts Thursday, July 18

I  !  ^  Women's and Girls
^  Price Sale Ready-To-W^ar

 ̂ Back to School Special!  ̂
Junior LAWMAN Jeans -$10.00 off 

New Styles Included! j

Community reunion slated

By Gayle Reay
The Lockney High School Class of 

1952 met in Lubbock July 4 and 5 at 
the Barcelona Courts.

A short business meeting began 
with each one in troducing  their 
spouses and telling where they are 
now living and what they are doing.

The names of those who had died 
since graduation were read by Glenda 
Rhoten. They are John Kendall, 1942; 
Billy Earl Terrell, 1952; LouWana 
Rivers Eckels, 1973; Marie Scheele, 
1976; Mirl Morgan Lewis, 1993; 
Clifford Doyle "Tip" Jeffcoat, 1993; 
G arland Cox, 1993; Jackie  
M cC uistion, 1994; and Howard 
"Hoot" Gibson. Glenda also read a 
poem in honor of their memory.

The next get-together will be July 
4, 1998 in Lubbock with Glenda

New Books 
at the Library

NEW  IN FICTIO N ;
C ause o f D eath  by Patric ia  

Cornwell
Murder at the National Gallery bv 

Margaret Truman 
Treasure Box by Orson Scott Card 
Exclusive by Sandra Brown 
The Celestine Prophecy by James 

Redfield
Killing Critics by Carol O’Connell 
Lily > ^ ite  by Susan Isaacs 
Final Victim by Stephen J. Cannell
I ll£ __O utsider by Penelope

Williamson
Promises by Belva Plain 
The Deep End of the Ocean by 

Jacquelyn Mitchard 
Stone of Tears by Terry Goodkind 
Cold Fall by Hohn Gardner 
Mischief by Amanda Quick 
C ritical Judgm ent by M ichael 

Palmer
The R unaw ay Jury  By John 

Grisham
. Chance by Robert B. Parker

NEW IN N O N nC T IO N :
The C olor o f W atef by Jam es 

McBide
Simple Abundance by Sarah Ban 

Breathnach
The Choice by Bob Woodward 
Emotional Resilience by David 

Viscott
B eginning  L ife  by G erald ine 

Flanagan
No Shirt. No Shoes. No Problem! 

by Jeff Foxworthy 
Outrage by Vincent Bugliosi 
Starting and Running a Profiuble 

Investm ent C lub by Thom as E. 
O'Hara

Out of the Blue by Mark Victor 
Hansen

The Origin of Everyday Moods bv 
Robert E. Thayer 

Home Accents in a Flash by the 
Home Decorating Institute 

Midnight in the Garden of Good 
and Evil by John Berendt 

Healing Mind. Healthy Woman bv 
Alice D. Domar

Rhoten in charge o f food arrange­
ments and Bob Dorman and Ray 
Ferguson in charge of the meeting 
place and entertainment.

Those attending were: Bobby Ray 
and Surina Griffith of Abilene; Bob 
and Joy Dorman; R.L.. and Glenda 
(Readhimer) Rhoten; Ray and Becky 
Ferguson; Bob and LaVomq Baxter; 
Gerald and Bonnie Chambers; Jim 
and Elizabeth (Lester) Settle all of 
Lubbock; Joe and Peggy Nance of 
Plainview; Edgar and Bonnie (Singer) 
H artley o f  H ereford; B etty  Ann 
(N ance) H eines o f  L akev ille , 
Indianna; Bill and Nadine Stowe of 
Wichita Falls; Cody and Myra Boggs 
o f S tam ford ; K eith  and G eneva 
(Burke) Stansell and Boyd and Gayle 
(Sherman) Reay of Lockney.

Lots of visiting, picture taking and 
fine food was enjoyed by all.

By F lora McNeill
All residents of McCoy, Starkey, 

Blanco and Allmon communities are 
urged, along with all former residents 
of these communities to attend the 
44th Reunion in order to greet and 
visit with those coming great dis­
tances to visit with local people.

We have collected pictures of the 
early school and many pictures of 
pupils that you will be delighted to 
see. The day will be spent with groups 
"trying" to identify those in the old 
pictures, taking pictures o f those 
present on that day, and just visiting 
and recalling early experiences. Also

a bountiful basket lunch will be 
served at 12:30 p.m. giving those at­
tending church time to attend.

The membership of these commu­
nities are becoming fewer each year, 
so let's take advantage of the oppor­
tunity of visiting while there are those 
of us left to carry on these reunions.

Please make a special effort to at­
tend this meeting at Lighthouse Elec­
tric on the Matador highway on July 
21, 1996 with registration starting at 
10 a.m. This request of your atten­
dance is to enable us to continue our 
reunions. Please come and enjoy a 
wonderful day on July 21.

We Have Bridal Selections for: 

Ashley Daniel and Matt Whittle

(Payne (Pharmacu
‘ 200 S. Main, Floydada 983-5LU.

i/v
Athena meets at Old Blue Quilt Box

Thanks for sending in your 
recipes! They will be published 
as space permits! Be watching 
for them!

If anyone else has any reci­
pes to send please include your 
name and nutil to Floyd County 
Hesperian, 111 E. Missouri, 
Floydada, Tx. 79235

By Neta M arble
The Athena Study Club held their 

June meeting at the Old Blue Quilt 
Box in Lockney. The program was on 
quilts . Each member made a square 
for the Sunbonnet Sue quilt that will 
be won by some lucky member at the 
December Christmas party.

Jane Archer showed several quilts 
and quilt squares that she has pur­
chased at garage sales and from indi­
viduals.

During the business meeting Old 
Fashioned Saturday, the Floyd County 
Friends Vaudeville Show and Floyd 
County Fair were discussed.

Officers elected for the coming year 
are Shirley Hardin, president; Trish 
Davis, vice president; Pat Nelson, sec­

retary; Bcttye Jackson, treasurer; Neta 
M arble, repo rter; and D onnie 
Meriwether, historian.

The August meeting will be held at 
theFloyd County Museum and Nancy 
Marble will give the program.

Hostesses for the m eeting were 
Martha Sue Lusk and Mary Louise 
McCarter.

Members present at the meeting 
were m em bers M arilyn Anderson, 
M artha Sue L usk , M ary L ouise 
McCarter, Dorothy Hooten, Donnie 
Meriwether, Barbara Mathis, Denise 
D oucette , Pat N elson , and Neta 
Marble. Guests present were Jane Ar­
cher and Joyce Lopez.

A Un»c«r« HMlIh PoeHlty
Lockney Care Center
401 North Main Sleet •

P.O. Box 1060 •  Lockney, Texas 79241 •
806 / 652-3375

LOCKNEY CARE CENTER
is a Medicare approved facility providing 

skilled services such as . . . .

Physical Therapy 
Occupational Therapy 
Speech Therapy

Respiratory Therapy 
I.V. Therapy 
Short Term Rehab

Contact Clay Keller for 
information regarding these 

services at . . .
(806) 652-3375

Bridal Selections Available for:

Ashley Daniel and Matt Whittle

Sue's Gifts & Accessories
100 E. California, Floydada 983-5312

R E T U R N  T O  L E A R N
Millions of adults are finding that a college degree is their ticket to new and exciting 
career opportunities, promotions and better paying jobs. To acquaint you with our 

programs designed for adults, Wayland Baptist University presents 
Return to Leam--a 90-minute seminar for adults interested in returning to school to

earn a college degree.

RETURN TO LEARN
Aug. 1, 1996 at 7:00 p.m.

Room 211 of the McLung University Center

For more information call 806-296-4709.

W a y l a n d  B a p t i s t  U n i v e r s i t y

'We were lost and stuck in the sand."
"I wanted to take a group of young people from our church on a picnic and fishing at a local farm pond. However, 
my good intentions almost turned into a disaster when I received the wrong directions on how to get to the pond. 
After driving what seemed like in circles, we ended up stuck in sand four or five miles from the main road. 
Fortunately, 1 had a Digital Cellular car phone. 1 called for help and 30 minutes later we were pulled out 
of the sand and headed in the right direction.”

"I don't go anywhere without my Digital Cellular phone."
IN FLOYDADAs City Auto, Inc. • 201 E. Missouri • H06/9H3-3767 

Oden Chevrolet-Olds •221  S. Main • 806/983-3789

DigHal CeButar Good As Our Word.
O  F  “T E X A S

Box 53118 • Lubbock, Texas 79453 •1-800-662-8805 • 806-924-5432
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Family Reunions
Burgett Reunion Colston Reunion

M embers o f the Burgett Family 
Reunion and friends gathered Satur­
day evening July 13 at the Massie 
Activity Center for a sandwich sup­
per and a lot o f visiting.

The yearly event continued on Sun­
day the 14 of July, beginning with 
early morning sweet rolls and coffee 
and a noon meal catered by Neilson's 
Restaurant.

A business meeting was held after­
wards. The book, "The M iller’s of 
Sand M ountain" authored by Julia 
Benoit, was purchased and presented 
to the Genealogical Collection at the 
Floyd County Museum in memory of 
The B urgett F a m ilie s  o f  F loyd  
County.

Those attending were: Quentin 
Burgett o f Weatherford; Eddie and 
Lois Brown, and M aire Carney of 
Lamesa; Louis and Clydelle Steen of 
S w eetw ater: G eorge  and  M illie  
Burgett, Jeff, Lisa, Jeri, Joshua, and 
Jacob Burgett all o f Amarillo.

G ene and N eom a Pace o f  
Skellytown; Sam Chick and Mary 
Burgett of Garland; Walter and Anna 
Fae George of Colem an; Bill and 
Lorene Burgett of Shallowater; Fred 
and Jo Carthel of Plainview; Monita 
B entiam  o f  C anyon ; A lden  and 
Shirley Carthel o f Snyder; Carla 
Baker, Red and Bonnie Jordan. And 
Betty Jordan, all o f Ft. Worth; and 
Vernon and LaJuana Henning o f 
Seminole were present.

Also attending were; Dollie Burgett 
and Ronnie Brown of Dallas; Jeanne 
and Hannah Parker, Jane Vaughn of 
H ouston ; Fay and Ruby G ooch, 
Margrette Holmes, Beulah Baker all 
of Floydada; Anna Belle Bingham, 
Bryan and Linda Burgett o f Lubbock; 
Nancy Mercer of Midland; and Eldon 
and E rm a D ean B urge tt o f 
Meridianville, Alabama.

Thomas D. and Laurel Burgett of 
Altoona, Alabama; Bobby and Nell 
Stanley o f Gadsden, Alabama; and 
Julia B enoit and LaVerne M iller 
Chatagnier, of Houma Louisiana were 
also present.

Carlton Reunion
The family of Aubrey and Elmina 

(Crow) Carlton, formerly of Friona, 
Texas, held their 11th annual reunion 
on July 6-7,1996, at Hoe and Margie 
(C arlton ) R ex ro d e 's  hom e in 
Lockney, Tx.

Special guests present were: Tina 
R exrode, Jim  P inner, and Ethyl 
Vernon, all of Lockney; Zula Carlton 
of Plainview; and Dorothy Crawford 
of Lubbock.

Fam ily m em bers present were: 
W ym an, Tam m y, S helby , and 
Devinney Rexrode of The Colony; 
Heath and Jeri Rexrode of Lockney; 
Sonny and Nell Carlton of Ovalo; 
Jerry, Liza, Barry and Ricky Carlton 
of Clovis, NM; and Jerry, Lisa, and 
Chelsea Nunez o f Clovis.

W alter, Renda, M arti, Toni and 
Casey Carlton o f El Paso; Milton and 
Sandi Carlton of Austin; David, Patti, 
Micah, and Jared Carlton o f Plano; 
Debbie C arlton o f  H art; Jim and 
Donette W eatherly o f Spade; and 
John, Kim, Brady, Kelsea and Tres 
Weatherly o f Amarillo.

D escendents o f  B.A. and S.R. 
Colston met Saturday and Sunday, 
July 13 and 14,1996 for their annual 
reunion.

Saturday, the group m et in the 
Roaring Springs club house at the 
Roaring Springs Ranch. They had a 
sandw ich lunch  and then in the 
evening, Mark Whittle and Billy Don 
Colston grilled hamburgers.

Swimming, games of Spinner and 
Bingo and a lot of visiting was en­
joyed by all.

A business meeting was held and 
they voted to have the reunion again 
in 1997 at the same time and pllace. 
The same officers remained in office.

Those attending from out of town 
were: Bumice Nance and grandson. 
Lane Joseph; Dee Cullender, Colin 
H olm es, o f  B lueridge; Jake and 
Wilma Colston, o f Eden; and Terri 
Wilcox, of Brownwood.

Attending from Floydada were: 
G.L. and Thelma Fawver, Raymond 
and Vonceil Colston, Edwin, Doris 
and Tammy Wilcox, Billy Don Sherry 
and Zane Colston, M ark, Teresa, 
Nathan, Matt and Tyson Whittle.

G uests were: Ashley Daniel of 
P la inv iew : N ikk i K indrick  and 
Christie DuBoise both o f Floydada.

King Reunion
FLOYDADA—Approximately 55 

descendants of Robert Alpheous and 
M elinda Bone King met Saturday, 
July 13 at the Massie Activity Center 
for their 27th annual reunion.

A t the business meeting Dale and 
Reta King of Houston were elected 
president. Each family took turns in­
troducing those present and telling 
about those that weren't able to be 
here.

After the business meeting a tour of 
the Floyd County Historical Museum 
was held and v isiting  con tinued  
throughout the afternoon.

Present at the reunion were Dale and 
R eta  K ing o f  H ouston ; B arbara  
H ark le rode  and M ollie  King 
Pemberton of Mineral Wells; Roger 
and Rosanne Hillhouse of LaMesa, 
California;

Quentin Burgett o f Weatherford; 
D onna, Tom and Laura Spore o f 
Lufkin; Larry, Nancy, Paul and Kristi 
King of Dallas; Sandra Sadler, of Lub­
bock; Raymond and Mary King of 
Lubbock;

LaJuana Henning of Seminole; Fred 
and daughter K endra Spinelli o f 
Plano; Walter and Anna Fae George 
of Coleman; Mysti Sturges of Arling­
ton; Tim and Tian Crawford of Lub­
bock; Zelma King of Levelland;

Tim and Mary Beth Karr of Lub­
bock; Phil King o f Dallas; Keith and 
Neta Marble o f Floydada; Jakey and 
Leora Younger of Floydada; Don and 
Nancy Marble of South Plains;

Brett, Gayla, Morgan and Miles 
Marble of South Plains; Jeff Cindy, 
E lizabeth  and H allie B ertrand of 
Floydada; Fred and Carolyn Marble 
o f  South P la ins; L e if  and Paige 
Younger of Floydada.

Guests visitng during the afternoon 
were Edna Beth Tye of Boydada and 
Mary Lou Bollman of Lockney.

God's Country 
performances set

By M artha  K irk
Boydada High School's own drama 

teacher, Ms. Belinda Maddox is serv­
ing as assistant director for the 11th 
annual production o f the outdoor 
dram a God's Country. Production 
dates are July 25 ,26 ,27 , and Aug. 1, 
2. 3.

Ms. Maddox teaches senior English 
and theatre at Boydada High School 
and is the UIL Coordinator. She has 
participated in several Lubbock com­
munity theatre productions and has 
taken students to UIL state one act 
play competition. She enjoys history, 
antiques collectibles, and music. She 
will be serving as the sole director 
during the actual performances.

Ms. Maddox's husband and son are 
both acting under her direction. Mel, 
a Lubbock businessman, plays the 
part of Uncle Hank, an early settler. 
Henry Clay Smith, or Uncle Hank, 
came to this area in 1876 from Fort 
Griffin. He was instrumental in bring­
ing 600 head of cattle to this area. He 
brought his family in 1878 and estab­
lished the first permanent settlement.

Eight-year old son. Drew, plays 
Pahko, the Indian son o f Quanah 
Parker. He is a 3rd grader at Duncan 
Elementary and enjoys sports, drama, 
rocks, and history.

E lizabeth Sm ith, "Aunt Hank", 
widely known for her hospitality in 
the 1870's, again  inv ites you to 
Blanco Canyon.

The story of the settlement of the 
Llano Estacado is told in the musical 
drama produced by the Rio Blanco 
Heritage Foundation. Community- 
based talent depicts the life and local 
history including both the joys and 
hardships faced by the early settlers.

The setting for God’s Country is the 
realistic atmosphere of Blanco Can­
yon, 10.5 miles north o f Crosbyton. 
For information or tickets call (806) 
675-2906.

Attention Readers!
Keep those recipes coming! Send your favorite recipe to:

Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon, 111 E. Missouri, Floydada, Tx. 79235

1996-97 O FFIC ER S INSTALLED -- O fliccn  of Floydada M asonic Lodge No. 712, installed in ceremonies on 
Juiy 9, a re  (L-R) Bill G ray, C haplain; Bobby Giililand, Sr. W arden; Roger Poage, Secretary; B ert Vandiver, 
W orshipftii M aster; Tim  Burge, Jr., IJeacon; Doyle Walls, T reasurer (Installing Officer); W ayland Jones, Sr., 
Deacon; K enneth Poole, T iler; and  Wa)me Russell, M aster of Ceremonies (Installing M arshal). O ther officers 
for 1996-97, not pictured, Rex H arrison, Jr. W arden; Boone Adams, Sr. Stew ard; John  Odom , Jr. S tew ard; 
and J.M . "Jim m y" W illson, Jr., M arshal. Courtesy Photo

£ o o ^

‘Bfio's !ĥ pu/l

Floydada Senior 
Citizens Menu

Monday, July 22: Baked chicken, 
red kidney beans, zucchini, tossed 
sa lad /R an ch  d re ss in g , ho t ro ll, 
peaches

Tuesday, July 23: Stuffed pepper 
casserole, green beans, cornbread, 
tossed salad with French dressing, 
chocolate cake
 ̂ Wednesday, July 24: Roast beef 
sandwich, brown gravy, tater tots, 
peas and carrots, sliced tomatoes, fruit 
salad

Thursday, July 25: Roasted turkey/ 
gravy, cornbread dressing, green 
beans, melon, wheat roll, pumpkih 
bars

Friday, July 26: Baked pork chop, 
mashed potatoes, mixed vegetables, 
coleslaw, bread, applesauce

BARRETT
Jaine and Ron Barrett of Mt. Juliet, 

Tennessee wish to announce the birth 
of their daughter, bom June 29,1996 
at 5:17 p.m. in Vanderbilt UMC in 
Nashville, Tn.

She weighed 7 lbs. and 3 ozs. and 
was 19 inches long.

Jaine (Guest) Barrett is a flight 
nurse for Vanderbilt. Little Brook had 
a record of 147 flights before her 
birth. "Granny Joy" and "Aunt Beth" 
Cowart of Plano were in Nashville for 
the birth.

Grandparents are Dick and Joy 
Guest of Boydada and Pauline Barrett 
of Atlanta, Georgia. Great-grandpar­
en ts include  P au line  C h itty  o f  
Silverton and R.C. Guest of Lubbock.

Wilcox appointed 
a d m i n i s t r a t o r

Unicare Health Facilities is proud 
to announce the appointment o f Kiki 
Wilcox as the new administrator of 
Boydada Nursing Home. Ms. Wilcox 
will assume responsibility for the op­
eration of the center on Monday July 
22.

A reception wilt be held for the new 
administrator from 11 a.m. to 1 p.m. 
Monday. The com e and go open 
house will be in the lobby of the nurs­
ing hom e loca ted  at 925 W est 
Crockett.

SHAKLEE ^
983-5246 J

!!! BEW ARE !!!
Medley - T\irner Reunion

Massie Activity Center - July 19th & 20th 
I f  you can't quieten them down 

_________ - join them !!

pHaking r o om  f o r  
n e w  i t em s  sa le .

s te rn s  2 0 -3 0  
50 -75% o ff

S a le  s t a r t s  ^ u ly 15-26
T h e  g a s k e t  C a s e

103 S. M ain, Lockney 652-2757

BRIDAL SELECTIONS FOR:

Ashley Daniel and Matt Whittle

are available at the...
'Irue Value B ridal G ift R egistry

inside
CAPROCK Motor Parts & Hardware 

114 W. California, Floydada 983-2865

'Country Music Singer

DeAnne TImberlake
Wiii perform a t the

F e e d  T r o u g h  S t e a k h o u s e

Saturday. July 2 0 .1 9 9 6  
9 :0 0  p.m. till 1:00 a.m.

Roaring Springs. Tx. S 0 6 -3 4 6 -7 9 0 6

I

1

LUNCH
IS

SERVED

T hursday . Ju ly  18lh
Lasagna

Strawberry Cake 
Friday , lu ly  19th 
Chicken N Stir Fry 

Cherry Cobbler 
M onday- lu lv  22nd 

Roast
Italian Cream Cake 
Thesday. July 23rd 

Spaghetti & Meat Balls 
Cookies N Cream Pie 

W ednesday. July 24dl 
Mexican Casserole 

Brownies
T hursday . Ju lv  25th 

Barbeque
Blackberry Cobbler

RESERVATIONS R EQ U IRED  
for Dinner between Vaudeville 

Shows, Saturday, August 17 - 6:30 
-8 :0 0  p.m. CALL NOW! Seating 
Limited. Partial Proceeds will be 
donated to B oyd County Friends

L a m p l ig h te r  I n n

102 S. 5th, Floydada 
983-3035

The Doctor 
is working iate!

Now you can get the same expert care from our physicians and nurses 
after normal business hours and on weekends.

Intfxxhidng convenient new hours (effective Oct. 23): 

Mon(day-Fri(day 8 a.m. - 7 p.m.
Saturday 9 a.m. -1 p.m.

(8 0 6 )9 8 3 -28 7 5

Cogdell Clinic
a service df

© U niversity Medical Center
Where the experts are

1-10x13
(W a ll P h o to )

1- 8x10
2- 5x7 
2- 3x5

16- King Size Wallets 
8- Regular Size Wallets

30
Color

Photos

994 Deposit 
$11.00 Due at 

Pick up
(plus tax)

WE USE 
KODAK PAPER

AT

AT: Pay-N-Save
220 South 2nd, Floydada

DATE: Wednesday, July 31 
PHOTO HOURS: 9-1 & 2-6

GROUP CHARGE 
.990 per person

(8)

FOP CneATIVeCOLOR PORTRAITS



TEXAS DELEGATION RECEIVES AW ARD-The 
Texas Delegation to  the National FHA Leadership 
M eeting received the "Youth At Its Best" aw ard at 
the convention. Shown here with the plaque are (l-r)
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City council 
votes to help 
repair truck

By Neta M arble
LOCKNEY—The Lockney City 

Council met Thursday night, July 11 
in regular session and covered a short 
agenda.

Lockney Volunteer Fire Department 
Chief Jimmy Kemp met with the coun­
cil and explained the damage to the 
Are truck that responds to fires out in 
the country. He asked the council to 
help pay one third of the expenses for 
having the truck repaired.

Kemp related, “We were fighting a 
grass fire east of town. When the wind 
shifted toward us we started out of the 
field and got stuck. The fire badly 
damaged a door, the tires, hoses and 
pump.

“We have had the door repaired and 
new tires installed. The hoses and 
nozzles have been ordered. We esti­
mate that it will cost $18,000 to get 
the truck back in operation. The cost 
of the pump itself is close to $ 14,000.”

He continued,” The pump on the 
truck is 32 years old and has served 
its time. It probably could be fixed but 
we decided that if you would pay part 
of the cost that we would order a new 
pump. The new pump will spray fur­
ther out and do a better job than the 
old one.”

The Floyd County Commissioners 
have agreed to pay $6,000.00 and the 
fire department will pay $6,000.00. We 
are asidng that you pick up the other 
$6,000.00.”

Council M ember Bil A nderson 
asked if the county helped with any of 
the expenses for fighting the fires out 
in the country and Kemp replied that 
the Floyd County Commissioners paid 
the City of Lockney $200 for each fire 
they responded to.

“They also pay the City of Lockney 
$500.00 a month for the ambulance 
and $250.00 a month to the fire de­
partment,” stated City Secretary Char­
lotte Hooten, “and this money goes 
into the fire department account.”

Anderson made the motion to help 
with the expenses on the fire truck. The 
second was made by Councilmember 
Tina Graves. All voted for the motion.

A brief discussion was held on con­
sidering full coverage insurance for all 
emergency vehicles. At the present 
time only liability is carried.

“This is the first time that we have 
had anything like this happen since 
I’ve been on the council,” stated Marr. 
“After talking to Jimmy I called sev­
eral towns, Floydada, Plainview and 
Tulia, and they only cany liability. 
But, I think this is something that we 
should look in to.”

Councilmembers asked Hooten to 
call for estimates and the subject will 
be put on the agenda for the next 
meeting.

M an reported on the presentation 
he made to the SPAG committee for 
the grant to replace the water tower. 
Attending the SPAG meeting with 
M an were Bil Anderson and Char­
lotte Hooten.

Anderson and Hooten both re­
ported that M an had done an excel­
lent job in presenting the need for the 
water tower. They stated that the com­
mittee thought that Lockney had a 
good chance of having their grant 
approved. The paperwork will go to 
Austin for final approval.

During Executive Session mem­
bers o f the board considered em­
ployee raises and overtime pay for the 
police department. Councilmember 
Rodger Stapp made the motion to 
give a $50.00 raise  to  A rcenio  
M aninez. J.D. Copeland made the 
second. All voted for. The council dis­
cussed overtime pay for the members 
of the police department and decided 
to take no action at this time.

Marr asked councilmembers to be 
thinking about items that needed to 
be added to the 1996-97 budget. Af­
ter some discussion the council de­
cided to schedule a workshop to work 
on the budget.

One bid was received on the swim­
ming pool slide. The council voted to 
accept the $51.00 bid.

D uring departm ental reports 
Rodger Stapp asked where the pool 
hall permit stood and Hooten related 
that the owner had not come in and 
picked up an application for a permit 
since they had passed the new pool 
hall ordinance.

Marr reported that Chief of Police 
Jerry Edwards would meet with the 
owner and find out if there are prob­
lems and that the council would go 
from there.

During regular business before the 
council the minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and approved, the 
current bills were reviewed and ap­
proved for payment. The financial 
statement was also reviewed. Several 
budget amendments and transfers 
were made.

Julie Ellison, Advisor; R ita M ann, Delegate; lYeena 
Aston, Advisor; Johnnie Mosley, 1997 FHA National 
President; all o f Lockney, and  Sharon Pierce, Texas 
Advisor from  Austin. Photo hy Lisa Mosley

R ita  Mann attends 
leadership meeting

Rita Mann, a junior at Lockney 
High School, was one o f the 250 
Texas delegates attending the 1996 
Future Homemakers o f America Na­
tional Leadership meeting, July 6-12, 
1996 in St. Louis, Missouri. Repre­
senting more than 36,000 members of 
the Texas Association, she was among 
approx im ate ly  4 ,000  delegates 
throughout the nation attending the 
four day conference.

The youth developed the meeting 
theme, "Imagine the Possibilities" and 
it was carried out as the members 
were inspired to imagine endless pos­
sibilities attainable by gaining "skills 
for life." Members were encouraged 
to develop  lead ersh ip  sk ills, 
strengthen family values and increase 
community involvement. Session and 
activities during the week included 
STAR (Students Taking Action with 
Recognition) event competition, in­
spiring speakers, updates on national 
programs, election o f the 1996-97 
national officers, introduction to a 
new national program. Families First, 
and a themed celebration at the con­
clusion of the meeting. Texas mem­
bers developed a plan of action for

the state and will implement it when 
returning to school in the fail.

Students also participated in com­
petitive events during the week, as 
well as, sharing success stories from 
Texas chapters. 69 students from 
Texas partic ipa ted  in the STAR 
Events during the week and others 
shared success stories from Texas 
chapters.

Rita's advisor is Julie Ellison. Rita 
also helped with the annual fitness 
"Fun Run" on Thursday morning. 
Many students and advisors partici­
pated in this event.

Future Homemakers of America is 
a vocational student organization for 
home economics education students 
in junior and senior high schools. This 
youth centered organization is the 
only vocational organization that has 
the family as its central focus and is 
an integral part of the home econom­
ics curriculum.

- / \ i i v e r t i s L t i ^
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Plainview YMCA 'o 

Fall Softball League
Registration Fee -  $200 sponsor fee and $15 player fee 

League begins August 12,1996

Register by Saturday, August 3
For information and registration contact the 

Plainview YMCA at 293-8319 -  313 Ennis, Plainview

Have a go o d

King Crossword
ACROSS 

1 Competent 
5 Nonfunctioning 
8 Support

12 Meadow 
noises

13 Mr. 2Uegfeld
14 Clinton 

Cabinet member
15 Drop down?
16 Bear hair
17 On the rocks
18 Accommodate 
20 Mediterranean

strip 
22 Thin pasta 
26 Watt’s power
29 “— Got a Secret’
30 Retriever type, 

for short
31 Calm before 

the storm
32 West of

Hollywood
33 Bruce’s Mrs.
34 Moreover
35 Pianist at 

Rick’s Cafe
36 Lent a hand
37 Bright red shades
40 New Rochelle 

school
41 Retreat 

community
45 Saxophone range
47 Check-casher’s 

two
49 Stratagem
50 AMA types
51 Seek restitution
52 Inter follower
53 “Day of Grace" 

memoirist
54 Print units
55 Bloke

24
25
26 
27

DOWN
1 Shot
2 Nitwit
3 Droop
4 Summery
5 Bid
6 Winter woe
7 Accept an 

apology
8 Game show 35

booty 36
9 Brought back 38 

to mind
lOA Chorus Line39 

showstopper 42
11 Spacecraft 43 

chamber 44
19 Bijou
21 Dogfight f  

participant
23 Joe Robbie
Stadium squad

Metallic fabric
Footnote abbr.
Pole, for one
Adjust the
strings
Eerie
Vague
discomfort
Symbol of
limpness
Sermon subject
Qn. follow-up
SquirTcl’s
pal on TV
Refuges
Hold the scepter
“D — dog"
Vegetarian’s
no-no
Oklahoma city
Acapulco
article
Bradstreet's
partner

1 2 3 n
Ti

15

l6

Answer on Classified Page 
This weekly feature is brought to you by:

Joe's Plants & Stuff
Floydada 100 S. Main 983-5050

IC E CREAM  SO CIA L W ELC O M ES BAND D IR E C T O R S-T he new 
band d irec to r and assistant fo r the Longhorn Band were introduced at 
an ice cream  social held last week by the Lockney Band Boosters. In tro ­
duced were (l-r) Brian Stew art, assistant director; his wife Jill, and Jim m ie 
Exline, director. S taff Photo

v e  a  S ^ j e  a n d

ATHLETIC PHYSICALS
Physicals will be given Friday, July 26th 

starting at 5:00 p.m. at the Lockney Longhorn 
Fieldhouse for all boy athletes, grades 7>12.

F I 5 H
Stocking of Hybrid 

Channel Catfish, Fathead
Now is the

Bluegill, F lorida H yrid Bass, ----------- ----------- , ----------- ^
Minnows, and T riploid G rass C arp. Perm it is required  for 
Triploid G rass C arp . The H ybrid Bluegill can REACH the M
weight of 2 1/2 to 3 lbs.

We furnish your H auling Containers. W e guarantee live delivery. 
Supplies - T urtle  T raps, Fish T raps, Liquid Fertilizer, Spawning 

M ats.
Delivery will be Tuesday, July  23,1996 a t the times listed for the 
following towns and locations.
Paducah - Farmers Coop Gin 
Roaring Springs-Thacker Supply Co.
Floydada - Producers Co-op Elevator 
Ralls-Crosby County Fuel Assoc.
Spur-Farmers Coop Gin & Supply

To place your order call:
405/777-2202 ‘Toll Free: 1-800-433-2950 • Fax #405-777-2899 

or Contact Your Local Feed Dealer 
F is h e ry  c o n s u lta n t a v a ila b le .

D is c o u n ts  a n d  F re e  D e liv e ry  o n  la rg e  o rd e rs . G ift c e r tific a te s  a re  a v a ila b le .

DUNN'S FISH FARM, Inc.
P. O. BOX 85, FITTSTOWN, Ok. 74842________

8:(X)- 9:00 a.m. 
10:00-11:00 a.m. 
12:00- 1:00 p.m. 
2 :00- 3:00 p.m. 
4:30 - 5:30 p.m.

492-3282
348-7216
983-2821
253-2518
271-3391

Adding On? 
Moving?

M easure y o u r 
ch a n g in g  needs 
w ith  a  free  State Farm  
Fam ily In su ran ce  Checkup.

NICK LONG
201 C aliforn ia , Floydada  

9S3-344I

State Farm Insurance Companies 
Home Offices: Bloomirigton. Illinois

im \ AUTO WUffS
NAPA SILVER " 
OIL FILTERS
For most domeslk okJ Import 
cars ond light trucks 
#21036,21258

NAPA POWER “ 60 MONTH BATTERY
Uplo500CCA's,l6024,26,;0,74

1
CHAMPION RESISTOR 
SPARK PLUGS
kp24is
SolePrice .............. ‘1.09 C
lasMoil-iriRelxite , .. -.X 
FtNAl COST 
AFnn REBATE

79'm m  lACH M|99
w /EXCH .

OnUMMUlOUWUH
FR EEum>i99MM-tNKlAn

wmrouuso M/rnonoitNr 
rat >4.99. 

SaSTDKKXt
onus.

ARMOR ML CAR WASH a ao
124 oil #25024 .. AkW

NAPA EVERCRAFT 11 -PC. COMBO WRENCH SETS
SAH7754)202 
METRIC #775-0203

YOUK CHOICl!

NAPA
REMANUFACTURED WATER PUMPS
#W511,W5062

AS low AS

TO 159.00 w/lXat

GUNK PUNCTURE SEAL TWIN PACK
keep ors m both cars hir em«rg>ic«.
(Tm 16-01. corrsItNinSTFS
Sole Price................ '7.99
less Moil-In Rebate -5.X

NAPA Auto Parts
118 S. Main, Floydada 983-6272

Sale ends July 31

We Keep America Running.
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Vacation Bible Ship sets 
sail a t Lockney FUMC

LO CK N EY  - The F irst U nited 
Methodist Church in Lockney invites 
children to set sail on Vacation Bible 
Ship.

"This year our church is taking a 
v a c a tio n ' from  V acation B ible 
School," says Tommie Beck. "Instead 
o f going to school, we're setting sail 
on Vacation Bible Ship. Kids won't 
find any boring reminders of tedious 
school work here. Our Vacation Bible 
Ship program  w ill p rov ide  fun, 
memorable Bible-leaming activities 
for kids o f all ages. Each day kids will 
sing catchy songs, play teamwork­
building games, nibble tasty treats 
from the ship's galley, sail into Bible

Floydada Lions 
to  ce lebra te  
h a lf a century

T he F loydada  L ions C lub  has 
reached the milestone of celebrating 
the 50th anniversary of the founding 
of the organization. Saturday. July 27, 
the civic organization will gather past 
and present member Lions together to 
celebrate a half a century of service 
to Floydada.

The Lions will meet at Massie Ac­
tivity Center at 6:30 p.m. to visit and 

I  get reacquainted before sitting down 
r  iO enjoy a meal together at 7:00 p.m.

The o rgan iza tion  has been 
aattempting to locate all former Lions. 
Any former member who has not re­
ceived an invitation to the SOth Anni­
versary celebration on July 27 should 
contact Sammy Hale.

adventures, and create unique crafts 
they'll take home and play with all 
summer long."

"Vacation Bible Ship is a five-day 
celebration of God's love. We’ll con­
clude each day with a festive Bible 
Ship show time program that gets 
everyone involved in celebrating 
what they've learned. Family mem­
bers and friends are encouraged to 
join us daily for this special time. We 
hope Vacation Bible Ship will spread 
G (^ 's love and joy throughout our 
community.

Vacation Bible Ship begins Sunday, 
July 21st and continues through 
Thursday, July 25th. Cruises depart 
from Lockney's Methodist Church 
each day at 6:00 p.m. and return at 
9:00 p.m. To register your children for 
this memorable Bible Ship experience 
please call the church office at 652- 
2193.

To the Pastor
of every Church 

in Lockney

Would you please 
preach a sermon on 
STEALING - 
Taking the fruit of 
someone elses labor,

Hurl McCoy

•1’Welcome Ahoarcf/

Join us as we set sail on the 
Vacation Bible Ship!

Come and enjoy fun crafts and games, exciting daily show 
times, tasty snacks, toe-tapping music...and new friends! 

SAILING FROM:
First United Methodist Church, Lockney

DAILY DEPARTURES:
Sunday, July 21 thru Thursday, July 25

DEPARTURE TIME:
6:00 p.m.

DOCKING TIME:
9:00 P.M.

FOR MORE INFORMATION:
Call the Church office at 652-2193

AGES:
Ages 4 thru 6th grade

"FOCUS ON THE FAMILY" with Dr. James Dobson

Q uestion: W hat is the "mid-life 
crisis" th a t m any m en experience? 
W hen does it typically occur, and 
how prevalent is it am ong men?

Dr. Dobson: It is a time of intense 
personal evaluation when frightening 
and d istu rb in g  th ough ts  surge 
through a man's mind, posing ques­
tions about who he is and why he's 
here and what it all means. It is a 
period of self-doubt and disenchant­
ment with everything familiar and 
stab le . It rep re sen ts  te rrify in g  
thoughts that can't be admitted or 
revealed even to those closest to him.

These anxieties often produce an 
uncomfortable separation between 
loved ones at a time when support and 
u nderstand ing  are despera te ly  
needed.

This time of self-doubt usually 
occurs during the third and fourth 
decades of life, but can transpire dur­
ing the fifth.

Concerning the incidence, Lee 
Stockford reported the findings of 
three studies involving more than 
2,100 persons, and concluded that 80 
percent of the executives between 34 
and 42 years of age experience a mid­
life trauma of some variety. This esti­
mate is consistant with my observa­
tions, especially among highly moti­
vated, successful business and pro­
fessional men.

Question: You believe a mujority 
of Americans experience low self­
esteem to one degree or another. 
Assuming this to be true, what are 
the collective implications of that

DR. DOBSON 

poor self-concept?

Dr.Dobson: It has serious implica­
tions for the stability of the American 
culture, because the health of an en­
tire society depends on the ease with 
which its individual members can 
gain personal acceptance. Thus, 
whenever the keys to self-esteem arc 
seemingly out of reach for a large 
percentage of people, as in 20th cen­
tury America today, then widespread 
mental illness, neuroticism, hatred, 
alcoholism, drug abuse, violence, and 
social disorder will certainly occur.

Personal worth is not something 
human beings arc free to take or 
leave. We must have it, and when it is 
unattainable, everybody suffers.

These questions and answers are ex­
cerpted from the book Dr. Dobson An­
swers Your Questiorts. Dr. James Dob­
son is a psychologist, author and presi­
dent o f Focus on the Family, a nonprofit 
organization dedicated to the preserva­
tion o f the home. Correspondence to Dr. 
Dobson should be addressed to: Focus 
on the Family. P.O. Box 444, Colorado 
Springs, CO 80903.

Floxd County Church D irectory

Dr, Dobson is brought to you courtesy of West 
College & 3rd Street Church of Christ, Lockney.

AIKEN BAPTIST CHURCH
Sunday School......... 10:00 a.m.
Morning W orship___11:00 a.m.
Evening W orship........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Bible S tudy............ 7:30 p.m.

BETHANY BAPTIST 
CH URCH

607 W . Lee S t ,  Floydada 
J.D . Young, Pastor

Sunday School..........10:00 a.m.
Morning W orship. . .  11:00 p.m.
Evening W orship........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening

Prayer M eeting........ 7:00 p.m.
*****

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
810 S. 3 rd , Floydada 

Darwin Robinson, Pastor
Sunday:

Sunday School. .  .10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship . .10:45 a.m. 
Prayer Meeting . . .  .6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . .  6:30 p.m. 

Wednesday:
Evening Services . .  8:00 p.m. 

*****
CALVARY 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Claude P o rte r, Pastor
Sunday School........... 9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship___11:00 a.m.
Bible S tudy.................. 6:00 p.m.
Evening W orship........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening.. 7:00 p.m. 

*****
C A RR’S CHAPEL

Service Every Sunday:
Morning W orship. . .  9:00 a.m.
Sunday School. . . .  10:30 a.m. 

*****
CHURCH O F CHRIST 
W est College & T hird, 

Lockney
F rank  D uckw orth, Evangelist
Morning W orship. . .  10:30 a.m. 
Evening W orship. . . .  5:30 p.m.
Wednesday Service..  .8:00 p.m. 

*****
CITY PARK 

CH URCH O F CH RIST 
Floydada

Gene M cC arty, M inister
Sunday:

Bible S tudy..............9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship.. 10:30 a.m. 
Evening W orship. . .  6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday:
Bible S tudy .............7:30 p.m.
(S um m er................. 8:(X)p.m.)

m *****
EVANS CH APEL 

BA PTIST CHURCH 
Rev. G.A. Blocker

Sunday School..........10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship . . .  11:(X) a.m. 
Afternoon W orship. .  .2:(X)p.m.
Training U nion........... 6:00 p.m.
Evening W orship........1:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Prayer M eeting........ 7:00 p.m.
*****

FIRST ASSEMBLY 
O F GOD CHURCH • 

701 W. M issouri, Floydada 
Vance M itchell, Pastor

Sunday School.........9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. .  .10:50 a.m. 
Sunday Evening

Evangelistic.............6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Night Service.......... 1:00 p.m.
*****

n U S T  BA PTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Howell E. Farnsworth J r. 
Pastor

M ichael Holster 
M usic/Adm ^Sr. Adults 

M arlon P ritchard , 
Students/Ed.

Sunday:
Sunday School.........9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. .  11 :(X) a.m. 
Discipleship Train. . .5:45 p.m. 
Evening Worship . . .  1:00 p.m. 
Wednesday:
Children's Choirs . .  4:(X) p.m.
Evening M ea l.........6:(X) p.m.
R.A.’s & G.A.'s........... 6:45 p.m.
Preschool C ho ir. . . .  6:45 p.m.
Prayer M eeting.........1:00 p.m.
Youth Bible Study . .  .1:00 p.m.
Adult C ho ir................7:45 p.m.

*****
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Lockney
H arold Abney, Pastor 

Les Reed, Youth M inister 
Kent Lloyd, M usic M inister

Sunday:
Sunday School............9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. .  .10:45 a.m. 
Discipleship

Training................6:00 p.m.
Kids of The King 

Children’s C ho ir.. .  6:00 p.m.
Evening W orship___7:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Prayer M eeting........ 1:00 p.m.
Youth Activities. .  . 7:00 p.m.
RA's and G A 's..........7:00 p.m.
Pre-School C hoir . .  .1:00  p.m.
Adult C hoir..............8:(X) p.m.

3rd Saturdays:
Men’s Breakfast. .  1:00 a.m. 

1st Tuesday and 3rd Mondays: 
Baptist Women . . .  3:(X) p.m. 

*****
FIRST CHRISTIAN 

CHURCH
Reverend lone Sedinger 

Pastor
Sunday School........... 9:45 a.m.
Sunday W orship___11 :(X) a.m.

*****
FIR ST UNITED 

M ETH O D IST CHURCH 
Floydada

C lark  W illiams, Pastor
Sunday School............9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. .  .11:(X) a.m.
Youth Fellow ship___5:(X) p.m.
Evening W orship___ 6:(X) p.m.

*****
FIR ST  UNITED 

M ETH O D IST CH URCH 
Lockney

Tom mie Beck, Pastor
Sunday School............9:15 a.m.
Worship Service___10:30 a.m.
U M Y ...........................5:00 p.m.
Evening W orship___6:00 p.m.
United Methodist Women,
Hill Circle, 3 rdT ues.. 9:30 a.m. 
Ruth Wesley Circle:
2nd & 4th Mondays . 10:30 a.m. 

*****
FRIEN DSH IP CHAPEL 

CM E 
Floydada

Rev. Jam es Jenkins
Sunday........................9:45 a.m.
Morning Service___11 :(X) a.m.
Wednesday:

Bible S tudy.............8:00 p.m.
*****

GRACE FELLOWSHH* 
CHURCH

211 N. M ain, Lockney 
Interdenom inational Church 

Rev. Ted Samples, Pastor
Sunday School............9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. . .  11 :(X) a.m.
Evening W orship........1:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service . .  .1:00 p.m. 

«***«
GRANT CHAPEL CHURCH 

O F GOD IN CH RIST 
John W illiams, Pastor

Sunday School......... 10:(X)a.m.
Monday W orship. . . .  11 :(X) a.m.
Evening Service.......... 7:30 p.m.
Tuesday:
Prayer Service.........8:00 p.m.

Wednesday Service.. .7:30 p.m. 
*****

IGLESIA DEL REY JESUS 
404 E. 6th S t ,  Lockney 

Lupe Banda, Pastor
Sunday School............10:00 a.m.
Evening Service...........6:(X) p.m.
Tuesday:

Youth Service............7:30 p.m.
*****

MAIN STREET 
CHURCH O F CHRIST 

Lockney
Ed Hull, M inister

Bible Study...................9:30 a.m.
Morning W orship. . .  10:30 a.m.
Evening W orship.........6:(X) p.m.
Wednesday:

Ladies Bible Class...9:30 a.m.
Bible S tudy.............. 7:30 p.m.

*****
M T. ZION 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Ralph Jackson
Sunday School..........10:(X)a.m.
Morning W orship___ 11:00 a.m.
B T U .......................................6:00 p.m.
Evening W orship.........7:(X)p.m.
Wednesday:

Mid-Week Prayer . .1 :00 p.m. 
Thursday:

Bible Study............... 7:00 p.m.
*****

NEW  SALEM PR IM ITIV E 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Sunday: Congregational

Singing............................. 10:30 a.m.
Morning Worship .. .1 1 :0 0  a.m. 

3rd Sunday, Elder Don Martin 
4th Sunday, Tom Taylor 

*****
PR IM ER IGLESIA 

BAUTISTA 
Lockney

Pedro Villareal, Pastor
Sunday School............. 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service........11 :(X) a.m.
Training U nion.......... 5:00 p.m.
Evening Service..........6:(X) p.m.
Wednesday Service . .  .7:30 p.m.
G .A .'s............................ 7:30 p.m.
Ambassadors................7:30 p.m.
Fellowship Luncheon - 

1st Sunday of Month;
Music Worship;
Last Sunday with evening service 

*****
PRIM ERA M ISION 

BAUTISTA 
Floydada 

Rev. Lupe Rando
Sunday School............. 9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship. . .  10:55 a.m.
Evening W orship........6:(X) p.m.
Wednesday Evening . .1:00 p.m. 
1st Wed___ Organization Night

*****

This page is brought to you through  
the courtesy o f the follow ing sponsors:

Barwise Gin
Barwise Community 

983-2737

Cargill
Hybrid Seeds

652-3339, Aiken

City Auto
201 E. Missouri - Floydada 

983-3767

Clark Pharmacy
320 N. Main - Lockney 

652-3353

Davis Lumber
102 E. Shurbet - Lockney 

652-3385

Goen & Goen 
Insurance

102 E. California 983-3524

Lighthouse 
Electric Coop

Floydada- 983-2184

Lockney 
Co-op Gin
Lockney - 652-3377

Lockney 
Ins. Agency

105 N. Main - Lockney - 652-3347

Garcia's 
OK Tire Store

308 S. Main - Floydada - 983-3370

Moore-Rose-White
Funeral Home

329 W. Calif., Floydada, 983-2525 
402 S. Main, Lockney, 652-2211

Oden
Chevrolet-Olds

221S. Main - Roydada - 983-3787

Payne Family 
Pharmacy

200 S. Main, Floydada, 983-5111

Schacht
Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts
112 W. Poplar, Lockney, 652-2385

The
Basket Case

103 S. Main, Lockney - 652-2757

Wilson
Aerial Spraying

Lockney - 652-2719

This space available 
for sponsor.
Call 983-3737

SAN JO SE
CA TH O LIC CHURCH 

Lockney
M sgr. T im  Schw ertner, Pastor
Wednesday:
Communion Service..8:(X)p.m.
Sunday M ass............ 11:30 a.m.

*****
SOUTH PLAINS 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
E rnest Stew art, Pasto r

Sunday School............10:(X) a.m.
Morning W orship____11:00 a.m

*****
SPANISH ASSEMBLY 

O F GOD TEM PLO  
GETSEM ANI 
308 Mississippi 

Rev. Thom as G. Lopez
Sunday School........... 10:(X) a.m.
Morning W orship___ 11:00 a.m.
Evening Evangelistic

Service..............................6:(X) p.m.
Wednesday:

Family N ight........... 7:30 p.m.
*****

ST. MARY M AGDALEN 
CA THO LIC CHURCH 

Floydada
F a th er E lbert Fadallan

Sunday M ass.............. 11:30 a.m.
Weekday M ass............ 7:30 p.m.

(Tuesday and Friday)
Phone: 983-5878 

*****
TEM PLO  BAUTISTA 

SALEM  
Lockney

Pedro Reyes, In terim  Pastor
Sunday School............9:45 p.m.
Worship Service.........11:00 a.m.
Christian Training —  5:00 p.m.
Evening W orship........6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Prayer M eeting..........7:30 p.m.
*****

TEM PL O  BETHEL 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY 

O F GOD
W ashington and  1st S t  

Lockney 652-2181
G abriel W. O rtiz, Pastor 

Olga L. M artinez, Youth Pastor
Sunday S choo l............ 9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship__ 11 :(X)a.m.
Evening Worship....... 5:(X)p.m.
Wednesday Service. . .  7:30 p.m. 

*****
TEM PLO  EVANGELICO 

PENTECOSTA L CHURCH 
N atividad Luna, Pastor 

515 E. M issouri, Floydada
Sunday School.............9:45 a.m.
Evening W orship.........5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service .. 7:(X)p.m. 

*****
TEM PLO  LIBERTAD 
203 SE 2nd, Lockney 

652-1104
Pastor Ju an  A. G utierrez

Wednesday Evening..  7:30 p.m.
Sunday School.......... I0:(X)a.m.
Sunday Worship...........5:00 p.m.

*****
TEM PLO  NUEVA VIDA 

Rev. H erm an M artinez 
308 W. Tennessee

Sunday School........... 10:00 a.m.
Prayer Service____ 2:(X) p.m.

Evening Worship....... 5:(X)p.m.
Tuesday:

Evening Service___ 7:30 p.m.
Thursday Service.........7:30 p.m.

*****
TEM PLO  PODER 

DE LA ALABANZA 
PENTECOSTES 

Rev. M anuel Rendon, Pastor 
704 N. M ain, Lockney 

652-3704
Sunday Services.......10:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening.......... 5:(X) p.m.
W ednesday...........................7:30 p.m.

*****
TRIN ITY  CHURCH 

500 W. Houston Floydada 
Interdenom inational C hurch 

C harlie Stice, Pastor 
983-5499

Sunday School.............9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship___ 10:50 a.m.
Sunday Evening.......... 6:(X) p.m.
W ednesday...........................1:00 p.m.

*****
TRINITY

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Providence Com m unity 
on FM  2301 293-3009

Rev. A rth u r P. Bliese Pastor
Sunday School &

Adult Bible C lass.. I0:(X) a.m.
Worship Service. . .  11:00 a.m. 

*****
W EST SIDE 

CH URCH O F CH RIST 
H oydada 983-3548

Sunday W orship  10:30 a.m.
Sunday Evening....... 6:00 p.m.
W ednesday................. 7:(X)p.m.

*****

Pay-n-Save
210 N. Main - Lockney 

652-2293

W orship at the 
Church o f your choice 

on Sunday
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CAROLYN "SIS" HILLMAN
Funeral services for Carolyn "Sis" 

Castleberry Hillman, 74, were at 10 
a.m. Saturday in First United Meth­
odist Church with the Rev. Rusty 
M cR eynolds, pastor, officiating. 
Burial was in Petersburg Cemetery by 
Lemons Funeral Home of Plainview.

Mrs. Hillman died at 8:15 p.m. 
Wednesday, July 10, 1996, in Meth­
odist Hospital in Lubbock.

She was born May 23, 1922, in 
Petersburg where she grew up and 
attended schools. She was a member 
of the Eastern Star, First United Meth­
odist Church and the WSCS, and the 
Petersburg Riding Club.

She married Slats Castleberry on 
Feb. 28, 1940, in Petersburg. He died 
April 22, 1975. She married Ray 
Hillman on Sept. 24, 1978, in Peters­
burg. He died Sept. 6, 1995.

Survivors include a daughter, Mrs. 
Doug (Jann) Pounds of Acuff; a son, 
Don Castleberry of Plainview; three 
brothers, J.W. Martin and R.B. Mar­
tin, both of Petersburg, and Albert 
Martin of Angleton; three sisters, Mrs. 
Robert (Corky) Fullingim of Peters­
burg, Mrs. Roy (Lyndell) Jackson of 
Plainview and Mrs. Frank (Helen) 
Breed of Floydada; five grandchil­
dren; 10 great-grandchildren; three 
step-grandchildren; and two step- 
great-grandchildren.

Two brothers, Wayne Howard and 
Buster Howard, are deceased.

R. R. SKINNER
Funeral services for Ruel Rollie 

(R.R.) Skinner, 76, o f Quitaque will 
be at 2:(X) p.m. Friday, July 19,1996, 
in the F irst B ap tist C hurch in 
Quitaque with Rev. J.E. Lee, a retired

This
Week’s 

Announcements
LOCKNEY LIBRARY
STORY HOUR
Lockney 4-H will host Story Hour 

at the Lockney Library on Main Street 
each Wednesday at 4 p.m. during the 
month of July. All ages are invited, 
however sessions will be focused to 
children over 3. For more informa­
tion, contact Doylene Dippery at the 
library or Kaci Mathis at 652-1121.

CNA CLASS
Rural Nurse Resource, Inc. (RNR), 

a nonprofit organization that provides 
health and safety education, will have 
a Certified Nurse Aide (CNA) Class. 
The CNA class will train individuals 
to care for patients in the Nursing 
Home, Hospice, Home Health, and 
private care setting. It is 6 weeks long 
and is limited to 12 students. The 
course will begin on August 5, 1996. 
To receive an application packet or 
for more information call RNR's of­
fice at (806) 983-8096.

PHOTOS NEEDED FOR
LOCKNEY HOM ECOM ING
The Lockney Homecoming Plan­

ning Committee is in need of old pho­
tographs to be used in a video that will 
be produced for the 1996 homecom­
ing business meeting, Saturday, Sep­
tember 21. The honor classes of 1943, 
1944, 1945, and 1946 w ill be 
highlighed in the video, but photos 
from all years will be utilized. Any­
one having photos they would loan 
should call D'Lyn Morris at 652-2270.

FLOYDADA SINGLES
Floydada Singles will meet Satur­

day, July 20 at 6 p.m. at the Senior 
Citizens building. Hostesses will be 
Doris Snodgrass, Edwina Hollums, 
Edna Patton and Modell Fyffe.

FISD ATHLETIC PHYSICALS
Floydada ISD will give physicals 

on August 1 to incoming 7th graders, 
9th graders, and any athlete who has 
had an injury in the last school year. 
Meet at the fieldhouse at 4:15 p.m. to 
go to Lubbock on the bus. If you don't 
attend you will be responsible to get 
your own physical.

DATE HIGH LOW
July 10 76 65
July 11 88 67
July 12 90 70
July 13 91 74
July 14 83 70
July 15 87 70
July 16 92 72

Dial Before You Dig!
(]all Enei)^ Company 
48 hours before you 
plan to dig in streets, 
alleys or easements.

will mark the loca­
tion of all our pipelines 
free of charge.
Be certain you’re safe. 
(]all Energas before 
you dig.

E N E R Q ^
l-«00-6<)2-4694

USD board adopts new policy
Baptist minister officiating. Assisting 
will be Rev. A nthony Sisem ore. 
Burial will be in the Smith Family 
Cemetery in Quitaque under the di­
rection of Moore-Rose-White Funeral 
Home of Floydada.

Mr. Skinner died Monday evening, 
July 15, 1996 in St. Anthony’s Hos­
pice in Amarillo.

He was bom February 24,1920, in 
Flomot, Texas to Sabastion Walter 
and Mattie Smith Skinner. He gradu­
ated from Flomot High School. He 
married Lura Ellen Meyers on Sep­
tember 21, 1946 in Washington. He 
was a retired electrician/electronics. 
He served in the United States Army 
during World War II. He had been a 
resident of Quitaque for the past 21 
years.

He is survived by his wife Ellen; 
three sons, W illiam of Quitaque, 
Virgil Glen and his wife, Pam of 
Weslaco, Texas; Walter Skinner and 
his wife, Kay of Carlsbad, N.M.; four 
daughters, Juan ita  S k inner o f 
Prescott, AZ, Mary Crites and her 
husband, Jimmy of Blossom, Texas, 
Bonnie Mott and her husband, Billy 
o f Sam R ayburn, Texas, C arol 
Sevanko and her husband, John, of 
Amarillo; one sister, Ruth Lee of 
Flomot, Texas; 13 grandchildren; 
seven great-grandchildren.

Pallbearers will be William Skin­
ner, Virgil Glen Skinner, Walter skin­
ner, Jimmy Crites, Billy Mott, and 
Billy Mac Farley. Honorary pallbear­
ers will be grandsons.

The body will lie in state at the First 
Baptist Church in Quitaque on Thurs­
day, July 18, 1996 from 9:00 a.m. 
until 7:00 p.m.

FLOYDADA
HO M ECO M IN G ’97
If anyone knows of a class party 

that will be held after the game or on 
Saturday, during homecoming week­
end, contact Laveta Morren at the 
school office, or Sharon Quisenberry, 
at the city office, as soon as possible.

SUM M ER READING CLUB
Summer Reading Club for ages 4- 

12, will begin meeting at the Floyd 
County Library on the following 
dates... July 3, 10, 17 and 24, 1996, 
from 10:00 a.m. to 11 :(X) a.m. Mem­
bers will receive coupons for Dairy 
Queen treats for every 5 hours of read­
ing. This program is sponsored by 
Floyd County Library^ The Texas 
State Library and Floydada Dairy 
Queen. The program s are led by 
Floyd County 4-H and the Texas Ag­
ricultural Extension Service. To reg­
ister call 983-4922.

LOCKNEY SALVATION
ARMY STORE
The Salvation  Arm y Store in 

Lockney is now open. Donations of 
clothing, toys, or books will be ap­
preciated.

ALCOHOLICS
ANONYMOUS
Alcoholics Anonymous and Al- 

Anons meet each Tuesday night at 
8:(X) p.m. Anyone wanting the loving 
fellowship of men and women who 
can share their experience, strength 
and hope are welcome. Meetings are 
held in the Floydada Municipal Build­
ing, at 114 W. Virginia. Anyone in­
terested may call 983-3635 or 652- 
3546.

VETERANS SERVICE
O FFIC ER AVAILABLE
Veterans Service Officer Ralph 

Jackson is available in the county 
courtroom on Friday afternoons from 
1:00 to 5:00 p.m.

WEATHER
Courtesy of Energas

By Alice Gilroy
L O C K N E Y -L ockney  School 

Board Trustees adopted new policies 
concerning fighting among students, 
participation in graduation ceremo­
nies, and proposed that the 1996 tax 
rate stay the same as the current year's 
tax rate.

On a 6 -1 vote, trustees agreed on a 
fighting policy proposed by the Lock­
ney High School and Junior High 
Principals, James Poole and Terry 
Ellison. The policy states that any 
fights which occur during the school 
day or school related activity will re­
sult in the following consequences:

"1st Offense: Charges will be filed 
with the Justice of the Peace and the 
offender will be fined $100.00 or 
community service;

"2nd Offense: Charges will again 
be filed at the J.P. office and with the 
Juvenile Probation Officer. A fine of 
$125.00 - $150.00 will be assessed;

"3rd Offense: Again referred to J.P. 
and Juvenile Probation; fined $150- 
$200 or com m unity  serv ice and 
placed in the Alternative School for 
the remainder of the year."

This policy will be in effect for the 
1996-97 school year and will cover a 
normal school day on or off campus 

'and any school related activity.
School Trustee Bemie Ford voted 

against the policy and stated he had a 
problem with the policy because of 
his worry that students may be afraid 
to defend themselves.

Principals Poole and Ellison both 
assured Ford and the board that the 
main purpose of the policy was to stop 
fighting and not to punish innocent 
children. "We will try and make sure 
that someone who is assaulted and 
only defending themselves will not 
face a fine," said Poole. "However, 
we have found that the great major­
ity of the time both students are at 
fault. We feel this policy is the only 
way we can be effective in dealing 
with fighting."

Trustees agreed unanimously on 
adopting the graduation policy, which

reads, "To graduate from Lockney 
High School and participate in Bac­
calaureate and Graduation ceremo­
nies, a student must successfully com­
plete the required number o f credits 
and pass a statewide exit-level exami­
nation."

A minimum of 25 credits is re­
quired for the 1996-97 school year. 
They include: English, 4 credits; 
Math, 3 credits; Science, 2 credits; 
Social Studies, 2 1/2; Economics, 1/ 
2; P.E. I 1/2; Health, 1/2; State Elec­
tives, 7; Local Electives, 4.

The board agreed to a proposed 
1996 tax rate of $1.1635, which is 
identical to the 1995 rate.

The Lockney Board reviewed blue 
prints and bids for the science wing 
and elementary classrooms and voted 
unanimously to reject all bids and re­
call the bids at the August meeting.

The trustees approved a resolution 
to reserve a portion of fund balance 
for the purchase of school buses and 
completion of urack complex (includ­
ing restrooms, stands and lights), con­
struction of elementary classrooms, a 
science wing and a possible audito­
rium at a later date.

School Board Attorney Paul Lyle 
appeared before the board and spoke 
to the trustees about Senate Bill I and 
the changes that have occurred be­
cause of that legislation.

"Everyone was told this bill would 
give more local control to the schools 
and it does just the opposite," said 
Lyle. Lyle said a lot of authority has 
been removed from the local school 
boards. There is less leeway for 
boards in the areas of teacher or stu­
dent discipline Lyle told the board.

The board approved the 1996-97 
lunch prices at 900 for elementary 
students, $ 1.00 for secondary students 
and $1.50 for adults. Breakfast will 
be 500 for students.

Reduced prices are 300 for break­
fast and 400 for lunch.

Trustees discussed upcoming board 
training seminars and decided to not 
attend a convention in Houston. To

save money the board chose to train 
locally.

Coach Moerbe reported the press 
box was nearing completion and the 
football workouts begin August 7.

The board approved payment of 
bills and Lusk reported LISD has 1.8 
million in investments to carry them 
into the next tax season. Lusk also 
reported that 96.01 % of the taxes have 
been collected and 99.66% of the

amount budgeted for tax revenue has 
been collected.

Attending the meeting were: Super­
in tenden t Lusk , T rustees M ike 
M athis, Jim Bob M artin, Carlton 
Johnson, Bernie Ford, Dan Smith, 
Jessie Garza and Louie Bybee, Prin­
c ipa ls  Pople , E llison  and Phil 
Cotham, Paul Lyle, Coach Moerbe, 
and the Hesperian-Beacon reporter.

MS
'A

w

MONITOR IN SERVICE •• Donations by local businesses has enabled 
Floydada EMS to add a Pulse-Ox Meter to the equipment available to 
assist emergency patients. Taking time to see what their contribution!^^ 
purchased are LeRoy Bums of City Auto, Laura Farris of Floydada F o r ^ ^  
Mercury, and Mike Giesecke of Oden Chevrolet Also pictur^ are EMT 
Sheryl Lecroy and paramedic Cliff Hacker. — Staff Photo

Floydada
Chiropractic Clinic

1. Sports Injury
2. Neck & Back Pain
3. Auto Accidents
4. Workers Compensation

Dr. Jerald Swanson DC, C.C.S.P.*
* Certifled in Sports Injuries

• Medicare & Medicaid Assignments Accepted 
Most Insurance Accepted • Easy Payment Plans 

• New Patients Welcome

HOURS:
Tbesday & Thursday 

9 :0 0 -6 :0 0  
By Appointment

983-6256
127 W. California St.

iA c ro M  F fo m  R  P h o lo g ra p h y l

My daughter wanted to know 
who handles our auto insurance

Then it hit me ...  she gets her 
drivers license neiit month!

“So what do I do? Who do I call? What kind of coverage will 
she need? How do I get the best insurance for my dollar?

No problem ... I'll just call my agent at 
Farm Bureau Insurance. 

8 0 6 -9 8 3 -3 7 7 7
If I have a problem, he’s always there. And, I can count on 

him to provide the insurance coverage I need for my family 

at competitive rates.

Whether it’s protecting your family through auto, 
home or life insurance, Farm Bureau Insurance has 

the coverage you need to plan for the future.

Texas Farm Bureau Mutual Insurance Co.
Texas Farm Bureau Underwriters 

Southern Farm Bureau Casualty Insurance Co. 
Southern Farm Bureau Life Insurance Co.

FARM
BUREAU

INSURANCE

966TXA11D

FLOYDADA FORD-MERCURY i . a o . . 9 « . 4 » .

1 USED TRUCKS USED CARS |
91 FORD F-150 Supercab, XLT....................................$12,995
96 FORD RANGER Supercab.................................. $14,995
95 FORD WINDSTAR Program Van........................$17,444
94 CHEV EXTENDED CAB 3/4Ton, Diesel $ ^ W 9 5 . $16,995 
86 CHEV CREW CAB 1 Ton Dually, 454, Auto. $6(995. .$8,495
91 DODGE CARAVAN 4 Wheel Drive......................... $9,995
94 FORD AEROSTAR, family fun.............................. $12,995
92 FORD F-150 4X4 XLT.......................................... $11,995
95 FORD RANGER Regular Cab XLT................. $11,995
91 FORD F-250 Regular Cab XL-V8, Auto..............$9,995

93 DODGE SPIRITAuto, 44 ,000 ....................... $8.9X5.. $8,500
95 FORD ESCORT Nice................................ $9,9X5.. .$9,500
89 FORD TEMPO 2 dr. Clean............................$3,d$5.. .$3,495
86 CADILLAC BROUGHAM, Clean................................. $5495
95 FORD CONTOUR, 4 drs....................... $13,5fes.. .$13,500
93 PONTIAC SUNBIRD, 4 dr, clean.............................. $8,495

L  E v e ry  U n it  In  S to c k  H a s  
M in o r  H a il D a m a g e  !!

9 8 3 -3 7 6 1  1 -8 0 0 -9 4 5 -4 2 6 0AND MANY MORE!!!

Stay With The
 ̂ From Floydada!

j? Community Related9{ursing and%cfiabi(itation facility

• 90 ^edLong Term Core
• 30 (Bed(Dementia Unit
• Completely Secure facility
• (Medicare and Medicaid

• Tornado Shelter
• d(ecreation Areas
• ‘Barber and ̂ Beauty Shop
• Chapel

Gertrude Carr George ‘Lacii’ Baclitell Edith FerguMiri

Prairie House Living Center
1301 Mesa Drive , Plainview, TX 79072 806-293-4855
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THE C LH SSIFIED S
AUTOMOTIVE FOR SALE

FOR SALE" 1979 Cheverolet Monte 
Carlo. Come by 815 West Lee or call 983- 
2252 after 6:30 pm. $395 or best offer. 
Daytime-983-2154. Ask for Don.

7-18p

CARDS OF THANKS

We want to thank our many friends who 
expressed their concern and sympathy 
during the illness and at the time of death 
of our beloved Daddy. Pa Pa and Great 
Pa Pa.

The cards, calls, food, flowers, memo­
rials and your prayers.

To Hospice of the Plains of Plainview, 
the nurses at Floydada Nursing Home, 
and Dr. Ahmad.

To Elder Nealey Richardson, Bio. Bra­
dley for the words that were such a com­
fort to our family.

To Mike Holster and Roberts Hardin 
for the beautiful songs and music.

And special thanks to the ladies that 
prepared and served the noon meal for 
the family at the First Baptist Church.

To Moore-Rose-White Funeral Home.
Your kindness will never be forgotten. 

May God bless you.
The Family of Hillery Polvadore 

Judy Rogers 
Nell & Babe Jones 

Eddie & Shirley Polvadore 
Harold & Mable Polvadore 

Grandchildren Great Grandchildren
7-18p

We want to thank all the many friends 
and loved ones who surrounded us with 
your love at the death of our Dad and 
Grandad, John T. Carthel. Your expres­
sion of respect for him is humbling.

To those who called or came, to those 
who contributed to the charities, to Broth­
ers Duckworth, Mosely, Shelburn, 
Langford and Johnson who ministered so 
lovingly to us all, to those who sent flow­
ers, to those who cared for our little ones 
during the sevice and assisted our large 
family in any way, and to those who com­
forted us by your presence and singing 
at the service-we thank you all from the 
bottom of our hearts.

The John T. Carthel Family 
7-18c

CHI LD CRRE S E R UI CE S

I HAVE THREE OPENINGS for 2-5 
yr. olds. Available beginning Aug. 12. 
Experienced. Call 652-3752.

7-18p

FOR RENT

Floydada
FOR RENT-2 b^room trailer house. 
Couples only. Call 983-2797.

7-18c

TRAILER for rent. 2 bedroom, 2 bath. 
$330/mo.Uui a 983-3761.

7-18c

O th e r

FOR RENT -  3 Bedroom, 2 Bath house, 
in Providence community. $375.00 per 
month plus deposit. Call Pat Thornton, 
Day, 293-4488 or Night, 296-2031.

tfn

A D V j^ J g J /N C

CRH
SYSTEMS

^  116 W . C A LIFO R N IA
98 3 -24 45  983-3151

‘ FO R  A LL  YO U R  C O M P U TE R  N E E D S ’  

V IS IT  O U R  S H O W R O O M  

E V E R Y D A Y  L O W  P R IC E S

GARAGE SALES

F loydada
G A ^ G E  SALE-Saturday, 915 Garri­
son. 9:00-7

7-18c

GARAGE SALE—Friday & Saturday, 
July 19 & 20. 308 S. 5th. 8 a.m.-7 Back 
to school clothes, girls short sets, dress, 
shoes, backpacks, boys jeans, shirts, Dal­
las Cowboy starter jacket, adult clothes, 
dishes, home interior, odds-n-ends. ALL 
SALES FINAL.

7-18p

MOVING SA LE-815 W. Ross. Thurs­
day, July 18 only. 8:30 til?

7-18c

GARAGE SALEl—905 W. Houston. Fri­
day, 5 to 8 p.m. & Saturday, 9 to 1.

7-18p

CONSIGN NOW!!!

AUCTION
2 S  tk Annudl SfecUl Hdrreft Equipment Auction 

August 20 thru 24,1996
Tuesday thru Friday -  Sale time: 10:00 a.m. each day 

Saturday, August 24 — Sale time 9:00 a.m. 
LOCATEDiPlaInvIew, Texas -  South side of town on Interstate 27 Busi­
ness Route on Hale County Airport Property (NOTE: II you are flying 
In, sale site close to Airfield). Take exit 45 or 53 off 1-27.
Deadline for getting equipment into place is Saturday. August 17,1996 at 

6 00 p m. -  Consignments will be accepted until August 17,1996.

•^F IV E  BIG DAYS*^
Tuesday, August 20,1996 -  Sale time 10 a.m.

Com bines comheads, headers, attachments, grain carls, augers, combine trailers, grain equip.

Wednesday, August 21.1996 -  Sale time 10 a.m.
Grain trucks, truck tractors, im piement trucks, trucks, trailers, float trailers & other truck puled 

trailers, motor homes and m obile homes
Thursday, August 22,1996 -  Sale time 10 a.m.

Cotton strippers (self propelled), cotton strippers (tractor mount), module buM ers, b o l buggies, 

cotton trailers, stock tra le rs , livestock equip., pipe eqdp. hey equip., enaNage eqUp.
Friday, August 23,1996 -  Saie time 10 a.m.

Tractors, loaders, front-end loaders, tractor makaHjps, grain drSa, backhoes, motor graeers, 

forklifts, crawlers, m iscelaneous reUrted items
Saturday. August 24,1996 -  Saie time 9 a.m.

IfTiptonwnto and tooto, itnplernent trailers, utity ta le rs , tanks tootoar make-ups, notv 

ciasslfled. P L E A S E  N O  S M A U  M IS C E L L A N E O U S  IT E M S  

N O T E - A ll eq u ip m e n t m u st b e  rem o ved  fro m  p ro p erly  b y  S e p te m b e r 1 0 .1 9 9 6 . 

COME ASMy.ER.PR consignor  
For fnoreTnfomnatT^  ̂or to consign, call

C ruce ^  F letch er
P.O. Box 609 “  Woltforth, Texas 79382

J a m e s  Q . C ru c e  
Plainview, Texas 
(806)206-5050 

Lie. *6704

AUCTIONEERS & REAL ESTATE 
BROKERS

B ob by F le tc h e r 
WOlflotth, Texas 
(008)866-4201 

Uc. •  7131

HELP WANTEb

m a n a g e r  INEEUED at Chamber of 
Commerce. To apply contact Chamber of 
Conuherce at 983-3434 or stop by Cham­
ber office at HOW. Virginia.

7-11c

EXPERIENCED IRRIGATION farm hand 
needed in Cone. Excellent salary. Call 
657-4490.

tfn

GARAGE SALE—Friday, June 19.1:(X) 
PM to ?? 908 W. Georgia.

7-18p

EXECUTIVE of multi-million dollar 
company seeks 1 or 2 people to develop 
business in the Panhandle. 806-935-5494.

7-25p

GARAGE SALE--drapes. cornice 
boards, bedspreads, bathroom & house­
hold decor, light fixtures, nice women's 
clothes (sizes 4-8). 814 W. Tennessee, Sat. 
7-7

7-llp

HELP WANTED-Year round employee 
for farm work: listing beds an important 
requirement. Other work includes setting 
cultivator, irrigation experience and cot­
ton stripping. If you have references and 
are interested in this job please call Louis 
Bearden at 983-2233.

7-18c

GARAGE SALE-Friday the 19th. 910 
W. Jackson at 8:30 a.m.

7-18p

HELP WANTED—Primary Home Care 
Attendants are needed in Floydada and 
surrounding areas to provide personal 
health care tasks as assigned to our cli­
ents. Take this opportunity to work for a 
health organization that cares for its cli­
ents as well as its employees. Contact 
Denise Stalcup RN at Interim Health Care 
Services, 791-5431 or 1-800-791-7007.

7-18c

L ockney
GARAGE SALE-517 SW 8th. Sat. 8 
a.m. Kids, mens, juniors & ladies clothea. 
New lawnmower, double stroller & toys.

7-18c

HELP WANTED-Busy clinic has two 
openings, one for receptionist and one for 
insurance clerk. Experience preferred. 
Applicants should mail resume to Marsha 
Allen, W.J. Mangold Memorial Hospital, 
POB 37, Lockney. Texas 79241.

7-18c
GARAGE SALE-Friday 9 a.m. to 77 1/ 
2 mile south of Lockney Meat Company, 
HWY 378.

7-18p

Other
BIG SALE—Thursday, Friday, & Satur­
day. 1725 Eubank, Matador. King size 
bedroom suit, microwave, chairs, china 
cabinet, crystal, china, silver, glassware. 
Old cards, books and papers, clocks, 
orientalia linens, jewelry, indian blankets. 
International riding lawnmower with 
blade and dump truck, TV’s & miscella­
neous.

7-18C

NO EXPERIENCE NEEDED-$500/ 
$900 weekly potential. Process mortgage 
refunds in your area. Part or full time, call 
1-216-233-4209. EXT. 160(24hrs.)

________  7-25p

HOUSES FOR SALE

Floydada
FOR SALE -3  Bedroom, 2 bath, C.H. 
and Air, carport, and storage house. Can 
move in with nothing down if you can 
qualify for loan. Call 983-5378 or 983- 
3700. tfc

HUGE PATIO & GARAGE SALE-3 
family: fishing, bowling balls, kitchen 
stuff, knick-knacks, plywood, tools, an­
tiques, clothes, furniture, some office 
equipment and supplies, and lots more. 
At Sandhill- from Floydada 8 miles west 
on FM 784 and north on 378, 1 & 1/4 
miles. From Lockney- 8 niles south on 
FM 378. Begins July 12 and continues 
thru July 29. Closed Wdenesdays.

7-18p

FOR SALE 3-2-2—2500 sq. ft. home. 
Excellent condition, work$hop,and good 
location. Call 983-2634 for appointment.

tfc

NICE TWO AND THREE bedroom 
homes in all areas of town. Several new 
ones just listed. For all your Real Estate 
needs, call Sam Hale Real Estate at 983- 
3261.

tfn

HOUSE FOR SALE-3 bedroom. 1 1/2 
bath with garage. Living room with fire­
place. Big backyard. 983-5107.

7-25c

Awareness Month 11

RESPECT
THE EARTH
RECYCLE!

ADAMS 
WELL SERVICE

Complete Irrigation Service 
5 Year Warranty 
Domestic Pump 

High Speed Bailing

720 N. 2nd 
983-5003

Script Printing 
& Office Suppiy
* Commercial Printing 

^Office Supplies & Furniture 
*Business Machines

1 0 8  S . M a in , F lo y d a d a  9 8 3 -5 1 3 1

Lloyd’s Manufacturing 
Farm Sheds, Corrals, Carports, 

Domestic Fencing. 
Insulated Well Houses in Stock. 
PORTABLE WELDER ON CALL 

300 W. California 
983-2105 o r MobUe 983-1741

HOUSES FOR SALE

FOR SALE BY OWNER -720 South 
Wall. Floydada. Large two bedroom home, 
comer 1 1/2 lot near elementary/middle 
schools, detached garage. Contact Linda 
Vick, home 713-789-3383, work 713-629- 
1580.

___________  7-25C

Other
FOR SA LE-1836 sq. ft. Brick. 3/2, CAJ 
H, FP with Storage Bam and fenced yard 
on 5 acres of land. South Plains. $45,(XX). 
Call 983-5772.

tfc

PERSONAL

REDUCE; Bum off fat fast. Take OPAL 
tablets and E-Vap Diuretic. Available at 
Payne’s Family Pharmacy.

7-25p

SERVICES

DON’S MUFFLER SHOP -All types of 
exhaust work, pickup and delivery, free 
estimates. We accept Discover Card. 210 
W. California. Floydada. TX. 983-2273. 
Out of town call 1-800-866-3670.

tfc

^  STORAGE UNITS -  For Rent. 16’x 13’ - 
IRISH SETTER-Adult male. To give to $35. Boat Storage - $35. Don Daniel. 983- 
good family. Call 983-5850 after 6:30. 2273.

7-25p tfn

SERVICES

HOUSE FOR SALE OR R^I^T

FOR SALE OR RENT-226 W. Tennes­
see. 2 bedroom, 1 bath. Central heat/AC. 
983-5699.

tfn

LARRY OGDEN AUCTIONEERING
-  Estates, Farm, Ranch, Business, Liqui­
dations. State Licensed and Bonded. 
(806)983-5808. TX #9240.

tfc

CONSTRUCTION, remodeling, add­
ons, cabinet building, formica countertops. 
Residential or commercial-Free estimates. 
Out of town orders welcomed. 806-652- 
1204.

8-8c

MISCELLANEOUS

CERAMICS, porcelain dolls, all kinds of 
crafts available at Velma’s Gifts, 1122 S. 
Main, Floydada. tfn

CEMENT WORK — Patios, sidewalks, 
driveways. 983-5120 and leave message, 
or Mobile Number 983-1120. Gary 
Bennett.

tfn

CONCRETE WORK—patios, porches, 
curbs, drive ways, sidewalks, storm cel­
lars. Free estimates. 296-9602.

7-18p

METAL ROOFS & metal buildings. J.R. 
Noland. 983-2087.

tfn

PAINTING, dry wall, repairs-interior ex­
terior. Richanl Taylor. 774-1673.

7-25p

Vl/ORK WANTED

WILL DO YOUR IRONING-By the 
piece. Cheryl Dawdy 983-3627. Pickup & 
Delivery.

tfc

FOR SALE-2 drawer fireproof safe-let- ^  
ter or legal $150. Don Daniel 983-2273.

tfn
P U B L IC  N O T IC E

GOOD ALFALFA HAY-small squares. 
Sell by bale or ton. 983-2969. Gene Bloys.

8-lp

LAKE PUMPS-floating or stationary. 
David McGowen. 983-2851. Missouri and 
Silvcrton Hwy.

7-18p

N O TICE O F  CA LLED M EETING FOR THE 
FLOYDADA INDEPENDENT SCHOO L DISTRICT

August 1 2 ,195Hii, 7:00 a.m ., Duncan Elem entary L ibrary

1. Adopt budget for 1996-97
2. Set tax rate for 1996-97

GREEN LAKE PUMP—6 in. complete 
A-1 condition with Chev. Bt. 652-2692.

7-25p

DRYER FOR SALE— Lady Kenmore- 
Good condition. $100. Call 983-2910.

nc

FOR SALE—2 complete twin beds with 
bookcase headboards and 2 large room­
fuls of extra nice plush beige carpet-$3.00 
per yard. Call 983-5242.

7-18p

CENTENNIAL EDITIONS 
OF THE

FLOYD COUNTY 
HESPERIAN-BEACON

Are available at 
H IE . Missouri, Floydada, 

or ] 16 S. Main, Lockney. $2.00 each.

TRANSPORTATION BID 
1996-97

Floydada Independent School District is now taxing bids for the pur­
chase of supplies necessary to operate the transportation vehicles. Bids 
will be opened August 13, 1996 at the regular meeting of the Board of 
Trustees. For information and bid instruction contact Jimmie Collins at 
226 West California, Floydada, Texas 79235. (806-983-5167).
The Board reserves the right to reject any or all bids and to waive any 
formalities.

7 -18,25c

MOBILE HOMES

Floydada
TRAILER HOUSE AND L O T -18x80 
Tiffany. 702 W. Ross. By appointment 
only. 806-562-0110 or digital pager 796- 
9871.

8-8p

Give Sameanc 
A Sm ilei

ESTATE AUCTION
REALIZE GREATER 

BENEFITS IN  AUCTIONS 
VERSUS-YARD SALE

AN Mid in 1-day,
Hair sattUmants solvad, 

Cash immadttaiy, 
Complata Racorda 

for Raal Eatata A paraonal
proparty aattianianta.

M O S K S  8c Z U H E R
fhe* o y w a a —
A U C T I O N E E R S

nOUTE ONE, D0X3I 1-HAUS. TEXAS 793S7 
DWAYNE MOSES Phono ?53-29A5 
PAUL ZUBER Phono 328-520-T
DOUG ZUBER Phono 525-4471

1990 t>y The Crosby County Nows & Chronicle

Answers to King Crossword
A B l ]eW o iF jFMPl R O p
M 0 s I f u R E N
M Q t I f 1 C E
B Q D n Q ia A Z A
^ ^ ■ V I E I R I M £ E L [1]

L U
A N

L A B
P E M 1
1
S

D E D

H R A M
R U S E
A L 1 A
Q E N T

Sponsored by:
Joe's Plants & Stuff

Roydada 100 S. Main 983-5050

X A S  s i  A  i i c w i m :  r i . A s s i i  i i ; i>  a d v k u  i i s i n c ;  n k  i w o k k

IrS'ERVlCl

[ e c o n o m ic a l  s t o r a g H
, TRY BARKER'S |
I Jewel Box Mini-Storage | 
I  Save your time and money j  
I Phone 652-2642 I
I  Cornar Main A Locust Locknay, Tx. |
^  Barker Building j

ADOPTION
AD O PTIO N • A  BRIGHT and love-filled 
future awaits your newborn. Caring, warm 
couple excited to share love and happiness with 
a baby. Vkki/Geoffrey 1-800-747-4937. It's 
UUgal to be paidfor anything beyond medical 
and legal expenses.

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY
FRIENDLY TOYS & gifts has openings for 
dealen and managers. No cash investment! 
Fantastic toys, home decor, Christmas items. 
CaU for catalog and infotmatian. 1-800-488- 
4875.

DRIVERS WANTED
CDLDRt VERS (TRACTORAiailer) -Travel 
first class with Werner Enteiprises. Vans,flau, 
TCU's, OTR, regional and dedicated oppoitu- 
nities. Full benefit package: first day health/ 
dental, 401K. Solo, ̂  teams and owner-opera- 
tofi welcome, weekly pay/settlements. Paid 
plates, tolls and scale tickets. 1 -800-346-2818.
DRIVER ■ CALARK INTERNATIONAL 
offers great pay, benefiu and the chaiKe to get 
home more often! Must be 22 with CDL and 
HazMat endorsement 1-800-950-8326._____
DRIVER - A NEW Buriingtan means a brighter 
future for you! $650f/week average. Great 
benefits. Generous bonus programs. OTR/ 
owner operator. Burlington Motor Carriers. 1- 
800-JOIN-BMC. EOR____________________
DRIVERS • FLATBED 48 lUte OTR. As­
signed new eonvenonnsis, mmpelitive pay. 
benefits. S1,000. Sign on bonus, rider program, 
flexible time off. Call Roadrunner Trucking 1- 
800-876-7784.___________________________
DRIVERS OTR TRACTORArailer drivers. 
Company A lease purchase opportunities for 
those who qualify. Company dnvers up to 28g 
per mile, Lmsc purchase zeio down. Late model 
walk-ins. CallArctic Express 1-800-927-0431.
DRIVERS. POSITIONS AVAILABLE at 
U J5. Xpress. No experience r^uired. Top pay, 
executive benefiu, and Freightline conven- 
tionals. 1 -800-879-7743. Minimum investment 
for training. EOE. M/F/V/H._______________
DRIVERS WANTED. E.L. PoweU A Sons, 
Tblsa, OK. We after late model equipment 
good insurance, mileage pay. One year verifi- 
aUeflatbedexperience.918-446-4447.1-800- 
444-3777._______________________________
HAROLD IVES TRUCKING needs mature 
individuals to enter our training program. Call 
1-888-270-1676 for complete information. 
Experienced drivers call: 1-800-842-0853.
MORE OPTIONS. MORE mUes. More 
monw. The best Convenant teams earn more 
than SIOO.OOO a year. Experienced drivers call

I -800-441-4394. Graduate studenu call 1-800- 
338-6428._______________________________
OWNER/OPERATORS NEEDED for three 
state short haul operations. Flatbed experience. 
Must have class A CDL Home weekends, 
earning top revenue. Dallas A Mavis 1-800- 
648-2424._______________________________
OWNER/OPERATORS WANTED: We of­
fer 79 centsMiile to start; 80 cenuAnile after 6 
months, loaded or empty. Why be away from 
home constantly? Contact: Jenell Tripp, Inter- 
sute Express, 918-836-8500 or t - ^ - 3 6 2 -  
6128.

EDUCATION
BECOME A MEDICAL transcripdonist. 
Opportunity to woik in an office typing for 
doctors. Home study. Free literature. P.C.D.L, 
Atlanta, Georgia. 1-800-362-7070 Dept. 
YYH722.

EXCHANGE STUDENTS
HELP PROMOTE WORLD peace by host­
ing a high school exchange student from 
S m d ituvia , Europe, South America, Asia, or 
Russia. Studenu arriving in August Call AISE 
1-800-SIBLING.

FINANCIAL SERVICES
(D EBT CONSOLIDATION FREES. Cut 
monthly paymerus up to 30-50%. Reduce inter­
est stop collection odls. Avoid bankruptcy free 
confidential help NCCS Non-proOt, Ucensed/
bonded. 1-800-955-0411__________________
n R S T  APPROACH PURCHASES notes, 
mortgages, annuities, personal injury claims, 
workmans comp. Lottery winning i nationwide I 
Receiving paymenu? Free kit explaiiu. Avail­
able 24 hours/weekends. Anytimel 1 -800-666- 
1498.___________________________________
LUMP SUM CASH for your owner-financed 
real esute notes. Qosing costs paid. Free 
quotes. We also do home mortgages and reft- 
nances. CaU nowl l-800-687-8'^6.________
MORTGAGES, ANNUITIES, BUSINESS 
notes. Receiving payments? Get cash nowl 
Colonial Financed, the nationwide leader since 
1984.1-800-969-1200 exL 20._____________
NEED MONEY? RECEIVING paymenu on 
a settlement or lottery? We will buy your future 
paymenu for cash today. R A P  ( ^ i t a l  Re- 
sources, 1-800-338-5815. Fast clositras.

FO R  SALE

MUSTSELL IMMEDIATELY! 3 allsiKl aich- 
style buiklitwtl 40x30 was $6,100 now $3,250. 
30x68 w u  $10900 now $6990. End walls are 
available. 1-800-715^482.__________________
OW N YOUR OWN home nowl No 
downpayment cn Miles materials. Innovsiiveoan-

sttuetkn financing. CaU MUes Homea today. 1- 
800-343-2884, e x i L _____________________
W OLFF TANNING BEDS. Tan u  home. 
Buy direct and aavel Commerdal^ome uniu 
from $ 1SI9.00. Low monthly paymenu. Free 
color catalog. Call today l-WX)-842-1305.

HEALTH
20/20 WITHOUT GLASSES! Safe, rapid, 
non-sufgical, peimanent restoration 6-8 w e^s. 
Airiine ̂ o t  d^eloped. Doctor m roved . Free 
infotmatian by mail: l-800-422-7320,exL237, 
406-961-5570, FAX 406-961-5577. hupM 
www.visipnficedom.com • Satisfaction guar- 
anleed._________________________________
PSORIASIS SUFFERERS -  NEW approved 
spray stops itchy flaky, red ikin or 100% 
money b ^ .  No tide eftecu. Woiks when 
everything else fails. CaU now 1-800-61- 
SPRAY.________________________________
RAPID WEIGHT LOSS. "Only $17.95." 
Bums faL calories, stops hunger. Lose 3-5 
potmdi/week. Money luck guaranteed. CaU 
forinfonnatioa United Pharmaceutical 1 -800- 
733-3288 (C.O.D.’s accepted).____________
XONEX HEALTH CAREGrot^, helps con- 
sumen save up to 70% on medical cotu, 
dentaL hearing, prescription and vision. Works 
with or withoutiruuranee. CaU713-335-1090, 
exL201.

REAL ESTAIE
33 AC. DUVAL county, brash. $1,000 down, 
$249/kno., 15 yrs., 11%; 35 AC.. Freer, elec­
tricity. $600 down, $24SAno., 20 yn ., 11 %. 1 - 
800-876-9720 SDNC@HILCONET.COM.
BARGAINS ON GOVERNMENT fore­
closed hemes. Save up to 50% or more. Mini­
mum or no down payment Repossessed prop­
erties sold daily. Listings available nowl 1- 
800-338-0020 ex t 299.___________________
FEDERAL LAND ACCESS 80 AC -$49,900 
enjoy life in the foothills of the Sangre De 
Cristo Mtns. Gently rolling, mix of fields A 
trees, 360 degree views, specuculsr rock out­
croppings. Long rd fromage, power A  phone, 
fmancing. Won't last, caU Majon Randi 719- 
142-57Cn, 8:30-8:30._____________________
KERR VILLE • 2.S TO  5 AC. Oak covered 
residential tracts, hiU country views, restric­
tions, paved roads, water and electric. Owner 
temis. low down payment CaU today 210- 
896-1020.

VACATION
WE ARE UNDERBOOKEDt Disney area 
vacatian s t^ s . 4 day/3 night hotel ptMkages, 
from $59. CaU now for reservaticait: 1-800- 
749-4045 ex t 115-tx899.

Call this new spaper for details on how to advertise statew ide.

http://www.visipnficedom.com
mailto:800-876-9720_SDNC@HILCONET.COM
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Farm safety camp set for 
August 10 in Plainview

The Ollie Liner Center here will be 
the site of a Progressive Farmer Farm 
Safety Day Camp, which is being 
sponsored locally by the Hale County 
and West Texas chapters o f Farm 
Safety 4 Just Kids.

The Progressive F irm e r Farm 
Safety Day Camps, sponsored nation­
ally by Progressive Farmer magazine, 
take an innovative, hands-on ap­
proach to safety education for kids. 
After launching the program with 19 
camps in 1995, Progressive Farmer 
is joining forces with local groups and 
national sponsors to hold 84 camps 
across the nation in 1996 - including 
one in Plainview on Saturday, August 
10.

The cam p teaches ch ild ren  in 
grades K-6 to be aware of safety haz­
ards on the farm.' Registration begins 
at 8:30 a.m., followed by the camp 
from 9 a.m. until 2:30 p.m. The $10 
admission price includes a T-shirt, 
noon meal, snacks and handouts.

To allow each child to receive per­
sonal attention, attendance will be 
limited to 200 campers on a first 
come, first-served basis. For registra­
tion information and a brochure, call 
1-800-235-5407, in Plainview, 291- 
4040, or in Lockney, 652-3371.

“Farming is one of the most re­
warding occupations in the world, but 
it’s also one of the most dangerous,” 
said Progressive Farmer Editor Jack 
Odle. “From the calls and letters we 
receive, it’s clear that even adults 
sometimes underestimate the dangers 
involved, and children almost always

do. Our goal is to teach kids to think 
before they act. We want to make 
safety a habit, and we want kids to 
have a good time developing that 
habit.”

Conducted in conjunction with the 
popular farm Safety 4 Just Kids pro­
gram, the camp will provide hands- 
on experience and demonstrations on 
general farm and home safety, ani­
mals, all-terrain vehicles (ATV) and 
bicycles, firearm s, lawn mowers, 
grain entrapment, tractors and roll 
over, wells, water safety, first aid, 
chemical and electrical safety, power 
take-off (PTO) safety, weather/envi- 
ronment, and other topics. Children 
will be taught the importance of a 
positive safety attitude.

“The farm is not only a home to 
many young people, but also a play­
ground and workplace,” said Richard 
Larsen, chapter representative of 
Farm Safety 4 Just Kids. “While the 
farm is a wonderful place to grow up, 
children between the ages of 5 and 
14 have the highest rate o f injury 
among all farm workers. Our goal is 
to prevent farm injuries and deaths by 
teaching children and teens about 
farm-related risks and showing them 
how to protect themselves and oth­
ers.”

Although the camps were origi­
nally designed for farm children, 
those who do not live on the farm are 
encouraged to attend. “Any child who 
visits grandparents on the farm or who 
operates an ATV or a riding lawn 
mower will benefit from the camp,” 
said Larsen.

NGSP to request review
The U.S. Court of Appeals for the 

District of Columbia recently denied 
NGSPs petition for a review of the 
Environmental Protection Agency's 
ban on granular carbofuran.

Sorghum producers in Kansas, Ne­
braska, Missouri, Oklahoma, New 
Mexico, and Texas used the product 
for many years to control several in­
sect pests that can severely damage 
grain sorghum.

However, ERA pesticide officials 
cancelled the federal registration for 
the product because of its toxicity to 
birds. NGSP protested the cancella­
tion, saying that the EPA records 
failed to document that the product 
actually caused any bird kills in sor­
ghum-growing areas.

In May 1995, NGSP filed the peti­
tion asking for a review by the court 
of the record on which the EPA base 
its decision to cancel use o f the pesti­
cide.

NGSP disagreed with the EPA's 
decision and initiated the petition to 
gain a more balanced review of the 
data.

"The appeals court used a very le­
nient standard for the EPA case," said

PRODUCER’S
COOPERATIVE

ELEVATOR
983*2821 - Floydada 

983-3770 - Dougherty

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK OF FLOYDADA

Floydada 983-3717

FLOYDADA 
COOPERATIVE 

GINS, INC.

Floydada 983-2884

NGSP's legal counsel, Gary Baise.
"The three judges ruled that EPA’s 

decision to ban the product must be 
upheld if it is supported by substan­
tial evidence when considered on the 
record as a whole," he said.

Baise said that the court also agreed 
EPA's argument that EPA need not 
demonstrate that granular carbofuran 
actually  causes an unreasonable 
amount of bird deaths in any crop.

Instead, EPA needed merely to 
show that granular carbofuran creates 
a significant probability that such 
consequences may occur.

He said that the cancellation pro­
cess set forth in federal law requires 
that a pesticide generally cause un­
reasonable adverse effects on the en­
vironment. Under the court's decision, 
however, EPA does not have to dem­
onstrate that a pesticide causes harm, 
but only show that it provides a risk 
of harm.

"The effect of the court's decision 
is to give EPA unfettered discretion," 
he said. "The federal pesticide stat­
ute does not give EPA such discre­
tion.

"EPA can limit or ban a pesticide 
with very little evidence or risk and 
no evidence of any actual harm, and 
future courts will likely uphold EPA's 
decision if the court's decision here 
is followed," he added.

Even though the judges ruled in 
EPA's favor on this issue, bringing the 
litigation did have positive results, 
Baise said.

"This case has let EPA know that 
they can't run rough-shod over users 
of pesticides. They are now aware that 
producers will fight back.

"EPA has held up on reviews of 
other granular products for the past 
three years," he said. "Our efforts kept 
them at bay, and as a result, EPA offi­
cials will have to be much more care­
ful in the future about asserting the 
risk of avian kills.

"They won't be able to cancel a 
product based on avian risk alone. 
Even thought they dodged a bullet this 
time, EPA will have to better docu­
ment their assertions in the future."

Baise has already filed the request 
with the court to reconsider the deci­
sion because of the mistakes made by 
the judges in writing their decision.

Poly Pipe is now avaiiabie

SIZES:
2 Ply 7 Mil. 

1320 '-1 /4  mile

12" -$172.50 roll 
9 " -  $145.00 roll

Various Size PLUGS in Stock

Lockney Cooperatives 
652-3377

Floyd County Farm News
TDA offers safety 
training for workers

'llie Texas Department of Agricul­
ture is providing a free seminar for 
farm workers and pesticide handlers 
on how to safely work around pesti­
cides at 7 p.m., Thursday, July 18, in 
Floydada.

Tlie training will held at the activ­
ity room of the RV park across the 
street from the Texas Migrant Coun­
cil Head Start Center, 702 N. 2nd.

This training provides farm work­
ers and other pesticide handlers the 
information they need to work safely 
around chemicals and treated areas. 
Topics covered in the sessions in­
clude, the Texas Agricultural Hazard

Communication Act, more commonly 
known as the Right-to-Know law, and 
the federal Worker Protection Stan­
dard requirements.

Agricultural employers who use 
pesticides are encouraged to send 
their employees to these sessions.

After completing the course, par­
ticipants receive U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency cards verifying 
that the trainee has received both 
W orker Protection S tandard and 
Right To Know training. These cards 
can be presented to employers.

For more information, contact TDA 
in Austin at (512) 463-7622.

Smith elected to PCG 
Executive Committee

/

By Shawn Wade
M em bers o f the P lains C otton 

Growers, Inc. (PCG) Board of Direc­
tors unanimously approved a new op­
erating budget for the 25 county pro­
ducer organization and elected mem­
bers to the executive committee.

The PCG Board approved a budget 
totaling $304,700 for fiscal year 1996- 
97, which began July 1. PCG Finance 
Committee Chairman Ronnie Hopper 
noted during his presentation of the 
budget recommendation that the PCG 
staff continues to do an outstanding job 
of organizational expenditures.

New ly elected  m em bers o f the 
1996-97 PCG Executive Committee 
are: District 1, Mark Williams, Parmer 
County; D istrict 2, Bud Redding, 
H ockley County; D istrict 3, Dan 
Sm ith, Floyd C ounty; D istric t 4, 
Benny Robertson, Dickens County; 
District 5, Ricky Bearden, Yoakum 
County; District 6, Wesley Butchee, 
Gaines County.

Current PCG officers and the two 
most recent past presidents are: Board 
Chairman Frank Jones, second most 
recent president Wayne HufTaker, PCG 
President Jackie Burris, PCG Vice 
President Don Langston, and PCG 
Secretary-Treasurer Ronnie Hopper.

In addition to the approval of a new 
operating budget the r c G  Board also 
worked through a lengthy agenda

V A U K V .
10 yr. Financing
■  Low down - Low fixed 

APR
■  No prepayment penalty
■  1st payment not due until 

Janury, 1997
■  Let your cash flow work out 

to allow you two machines 
this year instead of just 
one.
_________ or________

Super Cash 
Flow Terms

■  $150/D.U. down
■  Low fixed APR
■  5 Annual Payments
■  No prepayment penalty
■  1st payment not due until 

January, 1998
■  Interest free 'til Jan. '97

See Your Valley Dealer 
for a Quote and Get a Free 

SIX’Plua by Kooz!e9
The perfect insulated, cold drink 
and sandwich bag for any 
occasion...the field, the game, the 
park...just stop in before July 31st. 
2996 snd get yours free

VAUBV
The most trusted name 

in irrigation

VALLEY AG 
ELECTRIC, INC 
West Hwy 70, Olton

806-285-2648
Terry
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which included reports on the En­
hanced Diapause Control Program, 
Federal Crop Insurance, and the Plains 
Cotton Improvement Program.

In other business the PCG Board 
approved  PCG P resid en t Jack ie  
Burrus as the organization's represen­
tative at the upcoming National Cot­
ton Council, Cotton Incorporated and 
Cotton Board caucus in August.

PCG Board members also approved 
members to the 1996-97 Nominating 
and Executive Committees. The nomi­
nating committee is composed o f the 
organization's three most recent past 
Presidents plus members elected from 
the Board. Current PCG officers are 
not eligible to serve on the nominat­
ing committee. The PCG Executive 
Committee is made up of the current 
PCG officer corps, the two most re­
cent past presidents and an elected 
m em ^ r from each PCG's six districts.

Newly elected members of the PCG 
Nom inating Com m ittee are: Mark 
W illiam s, M ike H ughes, W esley 
Butchee, Rex McKinney and Kevin 
Riley. Other members of the nomi­
nating committee are the three imme­
diate PCG past presidents: Larry 
Nelson, Wayne Huffaker, and Frank 
Jones.

THORNTON’S DONATE TO BUILDING PROJECT— Ronnie ^  
Thornton presents a $1,000.00 check to Shawnda Foster, representing ^ 
Floyd County Friends. The money was won by Ronnie and Pat Thornton 
during the Floyd County Livestock Show and is being donated to the 
Multi-Purpose Center Buiiding Project. Staff Photo

Custom
Pesticide
Appiication

Larry Ferguson
Home.........983-3820
Mobile 983-1820

BURLESON MEMORIAL ROPING 
BURLESON ARENA

JULY--19— 20— 21— 1996

FRIDAY—.TULY 19

(:OWBOY TEAM SORTING 
$30 per Team (3)

1 Time Team Captain 
Enter at 2:30 p.m.
Sort at 3:00 p.m.

TEAMPENNING
$30 per Team (3)

1 Time Team Captain 
Enter at 5 p.m.

Pen at 5:30 p.m.

WASHER PITCH 
At Hay Barn 9 a.m. 

$30.00 per Team 
NO DoubleEntry

SATURDAY. .lULY 20

YOUTH HORSE EVENTS 
Enter at 8 a.m.

Potatoe Race—Flag Race 
Barrel Race-Pole Bending 

ALL EVENTS $4.00

3 AGE DIVISIONS 
PeeWee 7 & Under 

Junior 8—12 
Senior 13-18

SOUTH PLAINS
BARREL RACING ASSOCIATION 

JACKPOT 
Books Open 10 a.m.

SUNDAY. JULY 21
NOVICE TEAM ROPING 

Books Open 9 a.m.
Limited to 25 Teams 
#3.. J  FOR.. .$16 
Progressive After 1

Q fm  PASTURE ROPING {){}{} 
Books Open at Noon 

Introduction of Ropers 
1 p.m.

#4 NO VICE...4 fo r ...$40

#7.. .4 for.. .$80 
Progressive After 1

FOR MORE INFORMATION 
S.C. BURLESON 

806-983-2977

Exhibitions 11 a.m. 
Open Runs Noon

Exhibition-$3 
Open-$28 

40 & Over-$13 
8 & Under-$8 

9-14-$13 
15-19-$13

1500 Maturity-$20 
Exhibition—$3 
50 Novice-$6 

350 Novice-$12 
750 Novice-$15 
150 Novice-$9 

Open—$13

{}{}{} TEAM ROPINGS {}{}{}

. T l ’’!!' 

< ^ 0

#7 1/2.. .4 FOR . .  .$30
#5........ 3 FOR . . .  .$20
#4........ 3 FOR.. .  .$20

PROGRESSIVE AFTER 1 
DOLLAR Spurs to High Point Winner

* ♦ * PRIZES * * * 
Halters o o  TVopJiies 

Buckles 
Saddle Pads

CIRCLE A CATTLE 
CARLALFORD 

HEREFORD 806-289-5353


