
THE FLOYD CO UNH

Ofl 8 Newspaper May Be Recycled 
Floydada Pay-n-Save Each Friday!

Thursday, September 8 ,1994  ©The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon Floydada, Texas 79235 (USPS 202-680) Volume 98 Number 36

A view from
The

Lamplighter
___ By Ken Towery

for
Those of us in the press, or at least 

Ihc ones honest enough to admit it, of­
ten find ourselves in something of a 
quandary concerning the fundamental 
nature of our mission.

We claim, I believe with justification, 
that our mission Ls to trutlifully inform 
our readers concerning the events and 
issues of the day, or perhaps we should 
say “of our lime.”

There arc all sorts of argument within 
the press as tojust exactly how this is to 
be achieved. 1 believe the first real ar­
gument I ever had with my publisher, 
the late Jack I lowcrton, then the owner- 
publisher of the Cuero Daily Record, 
was on that very subject.

I was relatively new to the position of 
editor, (40 years ago) and was worried 
about how to treat a story that contained, 
in my view, a great many lies. It was 
one of those stories that came in over 
the United Press wire concerning our 
Congressman, one John Bell. He was a 
hometown boy, a former State Senator, 
whom we had supported mightily in our 
paper, but who later (after his election 
to Congress) became embroiled in the 
Veterans Land Scandals. (He was finally 
indicted in an adjoining county, but was 
able to get the indictment thrown out 
because one of the Grand Jurors had not 
paid his poll uix, tJiereby becoming an 
ineligible juror. Bell was never re-in­
dicted, bccau.se the DA, a political and 
university chum of his, took the posi­
tion that would be “double jeopardy.”)

At any rate, the story quoted the Con­
gressman making statements in Wash­
ington that I knew to be untruthful.They 
were self-serving statements, the kind 
some Congressmen make all the time, 
but tliey went a litde further than that. 
The comments dealt directly with his 
involvement in the scandals, protesting 
his innocence.

I expressed my frustration to 
Howerton over having to foist such lies 
upon our readers through our own news 
columns, since many people tend to be­
lieve what they read in the papers, or 
see on television, or hear on radio.

Howerton tcx)k modest umbrage. He 
was a good bit older, much more expe­
rienced, and much wiser thtui myself. He 
recognized tlic problem, but his position 
was Uiat we were not guilty of telling 
lies. Wc were telling tlic trudi, he said, 
since our mission was to accurately re­
lay to our readers w hat had happened, 
what had been said, even if what was 
said was in fact a lie. Wc were not re­
sponsible for tlie lies told by others in 
the process. We would treat that prob­
lem in our editorial opinion columns. 
(Which we did, and the Congressman 
was defeated in the next election.)

Howerton was of course right. Nev­
ertheless it did little then to relieve my 
own frustration and exa.speration. We 
still worry about it, though we have 
learned to live with it, after a fashion.

The bouom line, gentle rcadci; is this; 
Our job is to report, as accurately as wc 
can, what happened, or what was said. 
Wc do not vouch for tlic trutlifulncss of 
what was said, only that it was said. It is 
up to our readers to try to separate the 
wheat from the chaff. In that, wc try, in 
our signed columns, to occasionally be 
helpful, but even then it is up to the 
reader to determine where truth lies. 
People see things differently. They 
sometimes differ on what truth is. We 
learned long ago that one man’s meat is 
another man’s poison.

In passing, we would only say that if 
politicians voted in Washington the way 
they talk when they are back among the 
home folks, most of our frustration 
would disappear. And we think most 
people feel the same way.

Signs of our times: Our state's capitol 
city played host over the weekend to a 
couple of gatherings, one celebrating the 
past and the other, we suppose, the 
present and the future.

The state's Governor, Ann Richards, 
officially welcomed a sort of hippie 
homecoming, called the first annual 
Armadillo World Headquarters home­
coming concert Moderation, according 
to the local paper, was the order of the 
day,comparitivcly speaking.The paper's 
reporter noted that, while beer flowed
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The Royd and Surrounding Counties 
Fair will open its doors at the fair­
grounds located cast of Lockney on 
Thursday, September 15 and close on 
Sunday, September 18 after a four day 
run. The theme of the 41 st annual fair is 
“The Panhandle’s Best Farming, 
Ranching and Agribusiness”

Entry books are open from 4:00 - 7:00 
p.m.on Wednesday for the Women’s 
Department, Community Exhibits, Art 
Department and Agriculture Exhibits. 
The entry books will open again on 
Thursday morning from 9:00 -12:00 for 
all departments and exhibits.

Judging of all exhibits will begin at 
1:00 p.m. on Thursday.

All exhibits must te  left at the fair 
until Sunday and they can be picked up 
starting at 2:00 p.m. Anything left will 
be taken to the fair office and if not 
picked up will be discarded at a later 
date.

The board of directors officers for 
1994 arc Monty Teeter, president; Matt 
Williams, vice-president; Shawnda 
Foster, treasurer; Kim Teeter, secretary; 
and Tracy Long, reporter. The board 
also includes Leroy Thompson, Rise 
Ford, Greg and Cris Taylor, Kyle Brock, 
David and Bcttye Jackson, Doug and 
Traci Bradley, David and Tammy Ray, 
Christina Chesshir, Jeananne Williams, 
Richard Larsen, Evelyn Carroll, Vir­
ginia Rogc Yvonne Southerland, Ju­
lie Domian, Cindy Cotham, Jessie and 
Irene Gar-’-.i, and Pat Schwab.

Events scheduled and those in charge 
are listed below:

PARADE
The parade is scheduled for Saturday, 

September 17 at 10:30 a.m. Registration

will begin at 9:00 a.m. on the west side 
of D&J Gin. The parade will begin on 
the south end of Main S treet and proceed 
north to the Lockney Care Center. Nel­
lie Webb is the parade chairperson. For 
information call 652-2524.

FAIR QUEEN PAGEANT
The 31st annual Miss Floyd County 

Pageant will be held at 6:(X) p.m. Satur­
day night The 12th annual Young Miss, 
Junior Miss, Little Miss and Tiny Miss

pageants will be hcldat 1:00p.m. Satur­
day. Both pageants will be held in the 
Entertainment Building.Interviews are 
scheduled for Saturday, September 10th 
at 1:00 p.m. For more information con­
tact Shelia Poole at 652-2453.

ART DEPARTMENT
The Art Department would like to 

remind all kids and adults to line up their 
entries for the fair. Categories for kids 
include crayola, pencil, watercolor.

acrylic and mixed media. Adult catego­
ries include charcoal, oil and watercolor 
in landscape, marine, animal and still 
life.

Photographers are also encouraged to 
enter.

All adult enuies should be framed and 
wired for hanging and childrens entries 
matted in construction paper ready to 
hang. ContactJudySchacht at 983-2906 
or Laura W ilson if you need more infor­
mation or help.

1994 COUNTYCHAMPS-FHS cheerleaders join Whirl- utes remaining, Pete Cooper ran for a 45-yard touchdown 
winds in victory celebration following the thrilling 8-7 vie- and Sammy Rodriguez provided the deciding 2-point con- 
tory over Lockney. Trailing 7-0 with less than two min- version. -S ta ff photo

Contest over control, cost, curriculum

Education issues may sway voters
By Alice Gilroy
After bubbling above and below the 

surface of politics for many months, the 
issue of education has erupted as one of 
the factors that may well influence 
Texan’s voting in November,

Battle lines have been drawn, and the 
fight is in earnest. At least one could 
surmise that, by listening to those run­
ning for state and national office.

In the bigger picture the issues appear 
to be control and cost. Who is to control, 
or influence, what is taught in local 
schools? Is it to be the federal govern­
ment, the state government, or the local 
schools? And who is to pay, and how 
much? Arc local taxpayers, who now 
pay the lions’ share of school costs, to be 
stuck with additional costs dictated by 
federal or state mandates handed down 
from Washington or Austin?

Too, there is the question of just what 
is a “mandate.” Is a “string” attached to 
a federal program any different from a 
“mandate.” Is the federal government 
issuing a mandate when it says “here is 
some money, providing you teach the 
things wc think you ought to teach”?

In Roydada recently, and in subse­
quent campaign stops across the 13th 
Congressional District, Congressman 
Bill Sarpalius has defended his vote for 
HR 6, a federal funding program for 
elementary and secondary education.

Sarpalius defends his vote by saying 
the bill contains no mandates.

“The only mandates in the bill,” said 
Sarpalius, “are that no school can re­
ceive federal funding if they do not 
allow for voluntary prayer in the school 
and that no school can receive any fed­
eral funding if they teach any type of 
homosexuality or have any obscene 
material in their books." He said the 
school districts can pick and choose the 
programs they want from 130 different 
programs.

There arc many in the field of educa­
tion, and politics, who do not agree with 
Sarpalius’ assessment of HR 6 and its 
lack of mandates.

Mac Thomberry, of Amarillo, who is 
challenging Sarpalius for 13th District 
Congressional scat in November, said in 
a visit to Royd County recently that he 
would have voted against HR 6 because 
of its mandates, among other things.

“I would have voted against H.R.6,” 
Thomberry said. ‘The choice is not
whether school districts get federal as­
sistance or not The choice is whether 
federal assistance comes with federal

mandates, requirements, and strings or 
whether it comes without them.

Many provisions in HR 6 grew out of 
the previously enacted “Goals 2000” 
legislation, setting forth broad, long 
term “goals” for American education, 
and how to achieve those goals. They 
arc essentially companion measures, 
with HR 6 imposing as mandates three 
new sets of federal cun iculum standards 
that are technically “voluntary” under 
the Goals 20(X), that is, unless the suite 
applies for Goals 2(XX) dollars. Taken 
together, the bills have attracted bi-par­
tisan opponents as well as supporters.

William Hudson, of Wichita Falls, a 
Democratic member of the State Board 
of Education representing the 14ih 
Education District which includes 
Royd County, is one of those taking a 
dim view of the legislation.

“Goals 2CXX) is trying to nationalize 
education in America,” Hudson told this 
newspaper. “If wc nationalize our edu­
cation wc will stymie the initiative of 
our children.”

The Texas Suite Board of Education 
will be asked September 9 to appoint a 
committee to formulate a plan to imple­
ment the Goals project, and Hudson is 
one member of a bi-partisan group of the 
Board determined to oppose iu Other 
members arc Monte Hasie of Lubbock, 
in whose District Royd County previ­
ously fell, before the district lines were 
redrawn following the 1990 census, and 
Bob Offutt, of San Antonio.

“They arc trying to get us to ‘ volunUir- 
ily ’ join 20(X). It is like being asked to go 
to a picnic with someone and tlicy say 
they are going to feed you arsenic. I’m 
not going to that picnic,” said Hudson.

“If we don’t ‘volunteer’ we lose 7.1 
million dollars in federal money. We 
don’t need that money that bad,” said 
Hudson.

Similar sentiments were echoed by 
Hasie.

“A vote for Goals 2000 is a vote to 
undermine the board’s authority,” said 
Hasie. “We would be giving up a sub- 
suintial portion of our responsibilities to 
an appointed panel. Why should an un- 
elect^  panel that has to be appointed by 
the federal government develop a plan 
for Texas? If there are no strings at­
tached to this legislation, then let the 
Board, which was elected by the people 
of Texas, serve as the panel.”

Hudson noted that “the Commis­
sioner of Education Lionel Skip Mcno 
and Governor Ann Richards arc asking

the Suite Board of Education to give 
them permission to appoint a state 
committee to devise goals and educa­
tion objectives in Texas. The Governor 
would appoint half and the Commis­
sioner would appoint the other half. I 
don’t want to adopt that committee. I 
want the S tale Board of Education to be 
the committee.”’

“Every state that ‘volunteers’ to be 
part of Goals 2000 has to appoint the 
suite goals panel. That panel will be 
accountable to the National Education 
Standards and Improvement Council 
which was created under Goals 2000" 
Hudson said.

NESIC could effectively veto any 
curriculum decisions taken by a state or 
local school board.

“There will not be any need for a local 
or suite board of education,” Hudson 
said. “If we are suipid enough to get into 
this wc will relinquish our rights and I’m 
not going to relinquish our obligation to 
the people who elected me and turn it 
over to Washington.”

Texas Congressman Dick Armey, of 
Lewisville, a leading opponent of the 
recently-passed HJl. 6, and a former 
economics professor, said the new bill 
“creates 10 new elemenuiry and secon­
dary education programs on top of the 
current 36.

“The existing programs include the 
huge Chapter I program (bilingual edu­
cation, magnet schools and impact aid to

name a few). The new programs would 
include gender-equity education, a

Continued On Page 2

CARNIVAL
Tickets for the carnival rides will be 

75 cents apiece and can be purchased at 
the First National Bank in Lockney, 
D&J Gin, and Floydada Branch of FNB 
Lockney beginning Friday September 9 
through Wednesday, September 14. 
Tickets will also be sold at the elemen­
tary school Monday,Tuesday and Wed­
nesday from 7:30 to 7:50 a.m..

AUCTION
The “Old Time” Auction will be held 

Continued On Page 3

Second man 
charged in 
counterfeiting

A federal magistrate has charged a 
second Floydada man, 19-year-old. 
Armando Mala Lopez, with passing 
counterfeit money.

Lopez was picked up by Royd County 
Sheriffs DepartmenL August 29, on 
local warrants of bond forfeiture.

“Lopez was out on bond for DWI,” 
said Sheriff Charles Overstreet.

“Secret Service Agents came on 
August 31 and took Mata away on sus­
picion of passing counterfeit money.” 

According to Overstreet, Mata had 
been recognized in Plainview while he 
was attempting to pass a counterfeit $20 
bill at convenience store.

Lopez is accused of passing four 
phony $20 bills in Plainview, and one in 
Roydada which Lopez allegedly tried to 
give to an individual for payment of 
liquor.

The counterfeiting charge was read 
against Lopez by U .S. Magistrate J udge 
J.Q. Wamick Jr. Lopez was released on 
a $5,000 personal recognizance bond.

August 18 federal authorities had also 
charged Edward Casteneda, 22, of 
Roydada, with pa.ssing counterfeit bills 
in Floydada. According to Overstreet, 
Casteneda passed six $20.00 counterfeit 
bills in Roydada and an excess of 40 
bills around the West Texas region. 
Casteneda is out of jail on a personal 
recognizance bond.

Five persons injured 
in Lockney collision

Five people were injured in a two car 
collision at the intersection of FM 378 
and FM 97, in Lockney, Saturday, Sept. 
3. Law enforcement officers and EMS 
were called to the scene of the accident 
at 2:28 p.m.

According to DPS Trooper Marty 
Lucke, Preston Price, 64, of Quitaque, 
was southbound on FM 378 in a 1994 
Ford Pickup, and ran the stop sign at the 
intersection of 378 and FM 97, colliding 
with a 1993 Ford Van which was west 
bound on FM 97.

The van was driven by Don Earl 
Maddin, 64. of Hale Center and was 
occupied by three brothers: Daniel, 9, 
Josh, 12, and Kaleb Clay 13, of Semi­
nole. Maddin and all of the Clay chil­
dren were transported to W J. Mangold 
Memorial Hospital by Lockney EMS, 
where they were treated and released.

Price was taken to Mangold Memorial 
by Roydada EMS where he was air­
lifted by Aerocarc to a Lubbock ho.spi- 
tal.

According to DPS reports. Price ran 
the stop sign striking the van in the right 
side. Tlie van was knocked off the road. 
It was pushed into a road sign and came 
to rest in the Tastec Burger parking lot.

The pickup spun around and came to 
rest facing NE in the easlbound lane of 
FM97.

“Alcohol will be a contributing factor 
in this accident,” said Lucke. “Charges 
will be filed pending the results of the 
blood test.”

Lucke reminds drivers to wear their 
scat bells and urges everyone to watch 
slop signs and yield signs

“The fatality accident rate in Royd 
County has increased 200%,” said 
Lucke, “and the number of fatalities has 
increased 300% over the last year.”

According to Lucke, Maddin and 
Daniel Clay were wearing scat bells. 
Josh and Caleb Clay were asleep in the 
back scat and not wearing scat belts.

Price was not wearing a scat belt and 
was partially ejected from the pickup.

Mitchell to attend National 4-H Congress
-From  Meli.s.sa Long, CEA-HE
LOCKNEY-Tim MitchcU took top 

honors at State Rccordbook Judging in 
August and won the opportunity to at­
tend National 4-H Congress to be held 
December 3-7 in Orlando, Florida. Tim 
competed at the county and district lev­
els prior to state competition in the Rec­
reation category. A 4-H rccordbook is a 
compilation of work from the age of nine 
until present including project work, 
leadership, citizenship and community 
service activities.

As a part of Tim's recreation project, 
he has participated in several Share-the- 
Fun skits as well as attending camps. 4- 
H dances, 4-H exchange trips, and par- 
ticipating in family recreational oppoF- 
tunitics. Tim is a member of the Floyd 
County Recreation Team that completed 
training during the State 4-H Recre­

ational Team training at the Stale 4-H 
Center in Brownwood.

Members of the Royd County Rec­
reation Team have taught dance and folk 
games at neighboring county 4-H 
groups, led county camp activities, as­
sisted with the Floyd County Parent/ 
Leader Appreciation party and led Lock­
ney summer school participants in a bi­
cycle safety project.

In addition to Tim's recreation project 
activities, he has carried projects in 
sheep, food and nutrition, shooting 
sports, archery, and others. He has at­
tended 4-H Electric Camp, Slate Con­
gress and has been a two-year member 
of the Senior Rifle team that has com­
peted at Slate 4-H Roundup.

Tim is a member of the Lockney 4-H 
Club and is the son of Warren and Char­
lotte Mitchell of Lockney. TIM MITCHELL
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BY THE WAY!

BY
ALICE

GILROY

I found an AP story in the Lubbock AJ 
and Amarillo Globe that reminded meof 
the old movie, “Escape From New 
York.”

If you didn’t see that movie you didn’t 
miss anything, but the idea behind it has 
always stuck with me.

The movie stars Kurt Russell. He is a 
big time military hero who somehow 
went bad and is sent to prison. He is 
pulled from prison to go rescue the 
President of the United States who has 
crashed his plane in New YorkCity. The 
president is now a hostage of the New 
York City residents.

Oh I forgot—New York City is really 
a prison in this movie.

It seems the city got so bad that the 
state just put barbed wire around it, took 
out the decent folks, put up guards to 
make sure no one gets out—and then 
turned the city over to the punks.

The bad guys all have guns and their 
own kind of government and pecking 
order. Basically it’s a jungle in there and 
they just fend for themselves by stealing 
and killing each other. I always thought 
it was a pretty good idea.

It seems like someone else thought it 
was a good idea too.

Did you read about the two 17-year- 
old Tlingit Indian boys, Adrian Guthrie 
and Simon Roberts, who are going to be 
banished to separate islands by tribal 
elders for beating and robbing a pizza 
delivery man. The delivery man was 
beaten with a baseball bat and his hear­
ing and eyesight have been permanently 
damaged.

The AP story said it is the first case of 
a state court referring a criminal case to 
an American tribal panel for a tradi­
tional Indian punishment.

(The bleeding hearts won’t be able to 
stand it and the politically correct people 
will have a hard time bad mouthing the 
tribal judicial system.)

The young men will be provided with 
sleeping bags, tools for cutting firewood 
and gathering food. Supposedly they 
will have no way to contact the outside 
world during a year or more in exile on 
Alaskan offshore islands. Seems like the 
only other living things on these islands 
are animals—including black bears!!!

They will be helped to build a one 
room house and the experienced elders 
are going to make sure the men know 
how to hunt and fish before they leave 
them there.

The banished youth were being held 
under guard to prevent them from talk­
ing to the press (although a few state­
ments have gotten out) and supposedly 
they are going to be taken to the island in 
the middle of the night so no one knows 
where they are going.

Sounds pretty good doesn’t it. I think 
we ought to fill up those islands. There 
aren’t enough isl^ds for everybody to 
get their own. Eventually they’ll have to 
share.

But, realistically—how long do you 
think this is really going to last

Even if they ever realty make the trip 
before someone else steps in and says 
they can’t be subjected to such in-hu­
mane treatment—how long do you 
think it will take before Hard Copy or 
Inside Edition is rowing up there with a 
camera and microphone in hand.

If they don’t end up filming it on a day 
to day basis—the boys will get rich off 
their movie rights. Kurt Russell did.

Don’t worry about trying to squeeze 
supper in before the Floydada/ 
Brownfield football game. Just come 
early and eat at the Floydada Jr. High 
Cafeteria. The Floydada Lions Club is 
having their annud fund raising Fish 
Fry. You’ll not only be able to let some­
one else do the cooking and cleaning— 
you’ll be donating to a good cause.

Letter To The Editor
Letter-to-the-editon
For 25 to 30 years. Congress has taken 

much of our money and spent it on mas­
sive welfare and crime prevention pro­
grams that have actually helped create 
an environment conducive to crime. 
Most of these programs have been enof- 
mous failures in terms discouraging pro­
ductive work and destroying self esteem.

Our current President and Congress 
have promoted the attitude that govern­
ment will solve all our problems, includ­
ing crime, if we will only give them what 
they w ant. . .  our money.

Now they want more of our money in 
the so-called "Crime Bill". Along with 
this new federal money grab, they have 
told us that a ban on a large number of 
semi-automatic weapons is necessary to 
make our streets safe again. (Never mind 
the fact that even the F.B.I. crime reports 
indicate that these guns are very rarely 
used in crime.)

That is exactly what many of these 
same politicians, gun control advocates,

Education issues

and many in the press said about the 
"Brady Bill" five day waiting period 
before it was implemented last year 
However, since the "Brady Bill" has 
been in affect, homicides are way up in 
Lubbock this year, according to a recent 
article in the Lubbock A-J.

Why have our local gun control ex­
perts (Lubbock A-J Editorial Board) 
been so silent about the failure so far of 
the "Brady Bill" in their city?

What will it take to wake up the com­
placent public in this country that swal­
low the "gun control" garbage spewed 
out by a federal government and a fawn­
ing press who actually despise the ones 
that they purport to help?

To those of you who have taken the 
time to discover the truth about crime 
and gun conuol, keep the faith. Truth, 
backed up by the facts, and a wise vote 
in the elections will eventually reverse 
this perversity and madness.

Steven Puckett 
Lubbock, Tx

Continued From Page 1
community arts partnership program, 
and ‘coordination of services’ (school- 
based clinics),” said Armey.

“Because ^ I  states have become

Community Band 
plans rehearsals 
on Sundays

FLOYDADA—The Floyd County 
Community Band will reheai^ this Sun­
day afternoon from 3:30 until 4:45 p.m. 
at the Floydada High School Band Hall. 
It was decided at the oiganization meet­
ing on August 30, that the group would 
rehearse every other week and that the 
rehearsals would be on Sundays. Sep­
tember rehearsals will be on the 11 th and 
the 25th. The October rehearsals will be 
on the 7th, 16th and 30th.

"If you are an adult that used to play 
or still does play, come and join us," says 
Bobby Rainer, one of the organizers. 
"Also, high school and advanced junior 
high students arc welcome. If you no 
longer have an instrument, come any 
way. We can probably find one for you 
to use.

"This is not limited to just Floydada. 
We would love to have as many people 
from the community as possible. Lock- 
ney folks, please come and join us!"

The Lamplighter
Continued From Page 1
freely, the marijuana haze so prevalent 
in earlier years was not absent, and that 
"against considerable odds, the hippie 
party animals of the '70s had somehow 
become responsible, respectable citizens 
of the’90s."

Still, the governor was quoted as say­
ing, "I look out there, and y'all don't look 
any better than when I knew you be­
fore."

As she spoke the proprietor of a local 
establishment dropped his trousers, un­
buttoned his shirt and stripped down to 
his armadillo shorts and t-shirt.

The Armadillo World Headquarters, 
to refresh the memory of those UT stu­
dents from the '60s and 70s who might 
have forgotten, was a sort of bam-like 
structure just south of the river that once 
housed the old National Guard Armory, 
where many bands of the time per­
formed, and where folklore says much 
in the way of drugs, legal and illegal, 
was injest^. It has long since been tom 
down to make way for something else. 
The "reunion" was held in City Coli­
seum.

The other celebration was the semi­
annual gathering of the state’s homo­
sexual, or "gay" community. Newspa­
per reports said between 6,000 and 8,000 
out-of-towners were expected for the 
occasion. As far as we know, there was 
no official welcome, other than from 
editors of the new sp ^ i; which devoted 
much space and ink to the eagerly an­
ticipated event.

We are not informed as to which event 
actually proved the bigger drawing card.
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CAPROCK HOSPITAL DISTRICT

Dr. Antoine Albert & 
Nurse Practitioner 

Linda McClead

are now seeing 
patients at

COGDELL CLINIC
901 W. Crockett 

Floydada 
Phone: 983-2875

Office Hours 
8:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon 
1:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. 

Monday through Friday

i

dependent on Chapter I funds, it has 
become a convenient place to attach 
federal mandates and thus expand fed­
eral control over local schools.”

According to Congressman Armey 
the most disturbing mandates in HJi.6 
are the requirements that states must 
adopt three new kinds of standards:

(1) content standards specifying 
“what all children should know:,

(2) performance standards specifying 
“what all children should be able to do,” 
and

(3) “opportunity to leam” standards 
specifying what the state believes it 
would have to spend per pupil on such 
“inputs” as teachers salaries, books, and 
computers in order to achieve the eight 
National Educational Goals set forth in 
the recently enacted Goals 2000: Edu­
cate America Act.

“H Jl. 6 would further expand federal 
control over local schools,” said Armey. 

“In conjunction with the Goals 2000 
Act, which conveniently creates a 19- 
member (13 Democrats, 6 Republicans) 
national school board, known as NESIC

(National Education Standards and 
Improvement Council), to devise the 
newly required standards. HJl. 6 would 
almost certainly result in a uniform na­
tional curriculum approved by the Sec­
retary of Education in Washington.

“Because it affects all states, HR 6 
will be more damaging to local control 
over education because it takes the 
mandates in Goals 2000 and imposes 
them on everybody whether they are 
participating in Goals 2000 or not.

“If you don’t agree to HR 6 mandates 
you will lost all federal education fund­
ing, not just Goals 2000 funding.”

As parents and elected school board 
officials leam more about HJ^. 6 and it’s

companion. Goals 2000, a move has 
started in several states to persuade 
state-level education officials to say no 
to federal Goals 2000 funding.

Hudson seemed particulariy anxious 
to join the battle when the Board meets 
on September 9.

“The Governor wants to get rid of the 
Sute Board of Education,” said the 
Wichita Falls Democrat. “We have been 
a thorn in their side. But the people of 
Texas want an elected board to get away 
from rubber stamping. We don’t need to 
appoint a committee. The SBOE is a 
committee of 15 people duly and truly 
elected by the people to represent 
them.”

GOEN & GOEN
••Serving You For Over 65 Yearŝ ^

FARM - AUTO - HOME - LIFE - COMERCIAL 
102 E. California, Floydada 983-3524 

Pam Bennett Kyle Smith Elaine LaBaume
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Continued From Page 1
Thursday night beginning at 7:00 p.m,
^  the Entertainment Building. Sam 
rortenterry Auctioneers will be donat­
ing their services for this event Anyone 
with items to dorrate or fw more infOT- 
mation are asked to contact Kyle Brock 
at 652-3527.

DALLAS COWBOY
g a m e  t i c k e t s
Raffle tickets for the Dallas Cowboy 

Game can be bought at D&J Gin for 
$3.00 each.

CHUCKWAGON SUPPER 
The Chuckwagon Cook-off will be 

held on Saturday. The entry fee is 
$30.00 per wagon. Meal tickets for the 
Chuckwagon S upper are $5.00 each and 
can be purchased at D&J Gin or from 
any board member. Gregg Taylor is in 
charge of this event.

PEDAL PULL
The childrens tractor pedal pull will 

be held at 4:30 p.m. Friday in the enter- 
taiiunent buiding. Cargill Hybrid Seed 
employees will be in charge. Registra­
tion for this event will be held at school. 
Forms will be sent home on Friday to be 
brought back filled out prior to the 
competition.

5-K AND FUN RUN
The 7th annual 5-K and Fun Run will 

be held on Saturday morning. Pre-regis­
tration must be received by Saturday, 
September 10 to assure correct size t- 
shirt Late registration will be accepted. 
Corporate Sponscffs are the Fust Na­
tional Bank in Lockney, Lockney Cocp- 
erative and the Fair Board. For more 
information contact Jinna Turner at 
652-3355 or 652-2521.

HORSELESS RODEO 
The Horseless Rodeo is scheduled for 

Saturday afternoon. The books will 
open at 3:00 and the rodeo will begin at 
4:00. There are activities for ages 4-17. 
The Silver Spurs 4-H Horse Club is in 
charge. A $2.00 fee will be charged and 
a 50% jackpot paid.

BRIDGE TOURNAMENT 
The W omen’s Division of the 

Floydada Chamber of Commercce are 
sponsoring a BridgeToumament on 
Friday from 10:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. in 
the Entertainment Building.

TEAM PENNING
A Team Penning Competition will be 

held at the rodeo grounds on Saturday 
beginning at 1:00 p.m. The entry fee is 
$90.00 per team. Contact C. Byron 
Brock 847-2515 or 652-3527 for more 
information.

GOSPEL JAMBOREE 
“The Pcrrymans”,‘Texas Praise” and 

the “Holy Ghost Express will present 
some “Good Ole" Gospel Singing on 
Friday night at 8:00 p.m.

DANCE
The Dance will be held in the Enter­

tainment Building on Saturday night 
from 9:00 to 1:00. The Countiy Nites 
band will be singing and playing for 
everyones dancing and listening enjoy­
ment There will be a $5.00 per person 
charge.

l̂FWYDADA 

FORD;- MERCURY

RENTS CARS  
Starting at $19.95

LAMB JACKPOT
The Lamb Jackpot is set for Saturday 

afternoon beginning at 1:00 p.m. Entry 
cards are due at 10:00 a.mFor more 
information contact Darrell Rasco at 
652-2412; Kyle Brock at 652-3437 or 
BUI Davis at 652-3713.

STEER AND HEIFER JACKPOT 
The Steer and Heifer Jackpot is set for 

S unday at 1:00 P.M. Entry Fee is $40.00 
and weigh-in will be held from 8:00 to 
10:00 a.m. For more information con­
tact Jody Foster at 652-2383 or 652- 
3351.

WASHER PITCHING CONTEST 
The 7th Aimual Washer Pitiching 

Contest will be held on Saturday at 1:00. 
Entry fees are $20.00 per team or $10.00 
per person. Belt buckles and cashe 
prizes will be awarded. Charlie and 
Missy Minnick are chairmen, 652- 
3752.

VOLLEYBALL AND 
TUG-O-WAR
Volleyball - 1:00 p.m. Saturday - 

Divisions for Men, Women and Co-ed. 
A $30.00 fee per team wUl be charged. 
Prizes include T-Shirts, Trophies and 
ribbons.

Tug-O-War - 11:00 a.m. Saturday - 
The entry fee is $30.00 per team. Prizes 
include a U^veling trophy, plaque, T- 
shirts and ribbons. Johnny Aijona is 
chairman of both events and can be 
contacted at 652-2481. Assistants are 
Cruz Martinez and Joey Arjona.

TRAP SHOOT
The trap shoot is set for Saturday at 

10:00. Division for man, women and 
children. All events cost $3.00. The 
shoot will be held east of the fair build­
ing. Ray Macha is chairman and for 
more information call 293-7413. Assis­
tants are Lennie Gilroy, Jerry Edwards 
and Gregg Pierce.

AGRICULTURE EXHIBIT 
& TOP OF THE CROP
Entries in Utis department will be 

lim ited to one sample in ach lot, from the 
same farm or individual and must be 
from the crop of 1994. All exhibits must 
have been grown or produced in Floyd 
and surrounding counties. Chairman 
Larry Mullins, 652-2749; Assistant 
Kenneth Holt.

WOMEN’S DEPARTMENT
Anne Jones (983-2838) is overall 

chairman of the Women’s Division.She 
encourages everyone to bring in their 
exhibits. ‘The more entries we have the 
bettr the fair will be,” she stated.

Depanments in the Women’s Divi­
sion include: TEXTILES: Chairman, 
Johnnie Quisenberry, 652-2517; assis­
tant Codee Owens; TEXTILES II: 
Chairman D’Lynn Morris, 652-2270; 
Assistant Carolyn Jackson; CANNED 
FRUITS AND VEGETABLES: Chair­
man, D’Lee Powell, 652-2641; Assis­
tant, Lezlee Sherman; CULINARY 
DEPARTMENT: Chairman, Renee 
Hrbacek, 652-3161; Assistant Latona 
Davis.

YOUTH DEPARTMENT 
Categories include Junior & Senior 

Household Linens, Clothing, Canned 
Fruit, Canned Vegetables, Preserves 
and Jellies, and Culinary. Chairman, 
Michealle Stennett, 652-2571; Assis­
tant Victoy Stewart

HIGH SCHOOL HOME 
EC. COMPETITION 
Same categories as the Youth Depart­

ment Chairman Jane McAnally, 652- 
3707; Assistants Andy Ford

CRAFT DEPARTMENT
Categories include Hobday PArade, 

Craft Painting, Adults and Nursing 
Home Residents. Chairman, Alice

n . .

war

“Ife Checkup time”
The Allstate Protection Review to be exact 
Together, we examine your insur­
ance policies. Compare your 
ccMsrages to the changes in 
your life. Then make sure your 
Allstate Insurance Plan matches 
your needs. Let’s schedule X |l I S t S t B *
an ^pointment today. You're in good hands.

J & K INSURANCE 
121 W. California, Floydada • 983-3284 

620 S. M ain, Lockney - 652-3386

O W2 Altajif Inammcp CnmiMm' Nort*tw)k Illinois

Carthel, 652-2739; Assistant, Patricia 
Schwab.

FLOWER DEPARTMENT 
Categories include Horticulture, 

Roses, Cannas, Petunias, Marigolds, 
Dianthus, Zinnas, Gladiolas, Iris, Lilies, 
Other Annuals, Perennials, Anange- 
ments, and JuniorDivision. Chairm^, 
DaiLee McPherson, 652-3824; Assis­
tant. Carolyn Marble.

CHILDRENS BARNYARD 
A variety of farm animals for you to 

pet and perhaps even feed. Chairman, 
Cleatis and Betty Hayes

COMMUNITY EXHIBITS 
Each community must show 15 dif­

ferent kinds of agricultural products. 
They must be selected from a Ust of 
crops, canned fruits and vegetables. 
Chairman, Kerry Siders, 983-2806, 
Assistant S haw n^ Foster.

HIGH SCHOOL ART 
COMPETITION
Rules, regulations and categories of 

the Alt Department apply. Chairman, 
D’Linda Mullins, 652-2749.

HIGH SCHOOL AG 
COMPETITION
Categories include Livestock and 

Farm Equipment, General Shop Proj­
ects, Recreational and Home Conven­
ience and Finished Wood Projects. 
Chairman Lawson Rowell, 652-2798.

CATALOGS
All information, rules and regulations 

are printed in the fair catalogs. The cata­
log can be picked up from all fair board 
directors, and businesses in Lockney 
and Floydada.

Sarpalius mobile 
plans Lockney visit

LOCKNEY-U.S. Rep. Bill SarpaUus' 
mobile office will be in Lockney on 
September 16 from 10:00 a.m. to 11:00 
a.m. at the Post Office.

"I have always believed that to be an 
effective public servant you have to go 
to the people and hear their wants and 
needs," SarpaUus said. "I was elected not 
just to represent you, but to serve you. 
That's why I have this mobile office.” 

The mobile office will be traveling to 
each town in the district on a periodic 
basis. For more information, contact 
Guy Brown, Community Representa­
tive, at 817/767-0541.

We Salute 
In Lockney

HAPPY BIRTHDAY
Friday, Sept. 9: Rebecca Rendon, 

Patricia Garcia, Elizabeth Torrez, Shon 
Dale Baeza

Saturday, Sept 10: Eimi Hammit 
Randall Young

Sunday, Sept 11: Michael DeLeon, 
Robert Casillas, Ofelia Hernandez 

Monday, Sept 12: Evelyn Winn, 
Jennifer Dane, Jerry Reyna, Anthony 
Poole

Tuesday, Sept 13: Stacey Prather, 
Lauren Stewart

Wednesday, Sept 14: Mark Man- 
gum, Tracy Parvin LeFevre

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY 
Thursday, Sept 8: CharUe and Marie 

McQuhae
Sunday, Sept 11: Jose and Marina 

Foster. Mr. and Mrs. Alfonso Raissez 
Monday, Sept 12: George and Eve­

lyn Winn
Wednesday. Sept 14: Ira and Gail 

Henderson

We Salute 
In Floydada

HAPPY BIRTHDAY 
Thursday, Sept 8: Trisha Couresy, 

Heather Ware, John Hernandez, Ismael 
Garcia, Luis Ybarra Jr.

Friday, Sept 9: Isaac Ramirez, Aaron 
Rendon, Mandy Kay Holbert Joaquin 
Guerrero, Reta Pierce, Noelia 
Barrientos, Jimmie Ray Collins 

Saturday, Sept. 10: E lisavet 
Navarrette, Irene Jimenez, Rebecca 
Warren, Johnny Gourdon 

Sunday, Sept 11: Lourdes Chavez, 
Charla Adams, Connie Hurt, Roxanne 
Garcia, Vicki Derryberry, Katie Sand­
ers

Monday, Sept. 12: Matthew Abshier, 
Bronte Lw.Abcl Reyes 

Tuesday, Sept 13: Micheal Gilliland, 
Mita Chavarria

Wednesday, Sept. 14: Chris Collins, 
Larry Ferguson, Adrian Hernandez, 
Dustin Owens

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY
Thursday, Sept. 8: Johnny and Maigie 

Sue
Tuesday, Sept. 13: Ricky and Ilda 

Vasquez
Wednesday, S ep t 14: Larry and 

Renee Jones
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LOCKNEY HIGH EARNS RECOGNITION-The fac­
ulty of Lockney High School (shown here) recently re­
ceived a letter of commendation from Governor Richards 
after the school earned a recognized rating in this year's 
school performance reveiw. Richards told the faculty, "I 
am very proud of your commitment to excellence and to 
educational achievement" Richards praised the hard

work and dedication of the Lockney students and ex­
pressed her wishes that the students would continue to set 
high goals for themselves. She also said, "To the teachers 
and the principal, we have a responsibility to help these 
students open the doors of opportunity by continuing to 
encourage them to stay in school, to do well in school, and 
to set high academic goals for themselves.” Staff Photo

Dusty Anderson selected All-Am erican Scholar
FLOYDADA—The United States 

Achievement Academy has announced 
that Dusty Anderson has been named an 
All-American Scholar 

The USAA has established the All- 
American Scholar Award Program in 
order to offer d e s e e d  recognition to 
superior students who excel in the Aca­
demic disciplines. The All-American 
Scholars must earn a 3.3 or better grade 
point average. Only scholars selected by

a school instructor, counselor, or other 
qualified sponsor are accepted. These 
scholars are also eligible for other 
awards given by the USAA.

Anderson, who attends Floydada Jun­
ior High School, was nominated for this 
National Award by Mrs. Jones.

He will appear in the All-American 
Scholar Directory, which is published 
nationally.

"Recognizing and supporting our 
youth is more important than ever be- 
fwe in American history. Certainly, win­
ners of the All-American Scholar 
Awards should be congratulated and 
appreciated for their dedication to ex­
cellence and achievement," said Dc 
George Stevens, Executive Director of 
the United States Achievement Acad­

emy.
The Academy selects All-American 

Scholars upon the exclusive recommen- 
daticMis of teachers, coaches, counselors, 
and other qualified sponsors. Once 
awarded, the students may be recog­
nized by the USAA for other honors.

Anderson is the son of Mike and Bar­
bara Anderson of Floydada. He is the 
grandson of Joyce Drake Atkins of Ralls 
and Mr. and Mrs. Louis Anderson of 
Floydada.

n » T R R l" lT c H lR W R A O T
I Scotty Parrish, D. C. I
I 1807 34th S t, Lubbock I
I Call: 763-1479 or 791 -44511 

by appointment only j

DUSTY ANDERSON

Advertising in this 
newspaper, benefits 
your business and 

your
community.

MINCH IS SERVED!
* Try our leftovers for your evening meal-Call for details!*
Thurs.. Sept. 8 
Beef Stroganoff 
Cherry Cheesecake 
Tugs.. SepLU 
Barbeque & Trimmings 
Blackberry Cobbler

Fri.. Sent 9 
Roast & Veggies 
Codcies-N-Cream Pie 
Wed.. Sent. 14 
Baked Ham & Veggies 
Cherry Fantasia

Mon.. Sent. 12 
Chicken & Dressing 
Jefferson Davis Pie 
Thurs. Sept. IS 
Mexican Casserole 
Banana Supreme

(Visit our Parlour Gift Sho^

LAMPLIGHTER INN
102 S. 5th, Floydada 983-3035____________

Plai)§ to 
f b e

4 1 s t Annual

a

LI:

September 15,16,17,18  
at the fairgrounds 

east of Lockney

''Helping YOU ch an ge th ings fo r  the better*'

T B E F O S T  
SATIONML BANK  
OFFLOVBADA

Member F.D.I.C. Each Depositor Insured Up To $100,000 lcnocm
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State meeting of Family and Community 
Education Association focuses on family

-From  Melissa Long, CEA-HE 
Over 1.000 representatives of the 

Ibxas Association for Family and Com­
munity Education will be meeting for 
the annual state convention at the Lub­
bock Civic Center September 13-15. 
This year's focus is "The International 
Year of the Family."

The Texas Association for Family and 
Community Education (X\FCE) is a 
volunteer organization that supports

1 /

HOT DOG ANYONE?-Hot dogs and lemonade for ev­
eryone who stopped by were offered by representatives of 
the First National Bank in Lockney and the Floydada 
Branch of the First National Bank in Lockney during their

annual Customer Appreciation Days last Thursday and 
Friday. Floydada Branch M anager Paul Sharp and Judy 
Jackson of Lockney served guests at the Floydada event 
on Thursday. -StalT photo

W hirlwind Sams hold chapter meeting
By Marjorie McElyea
FLOYDADA—September 5 the 

Whirlwind Sams met at Lighthouse 
Electric for the chapter meeting.

The meeting was called to order by 
President Harold Reese. The birthday 
song was done for Robert Mepherson, 
Ruth and Rufus Lusk and the anniveF 
sary song was for J.W. and Betty 
G ilbreath and Harold and Andrea 
Temple.

Harold Reese gave the invocation and 
delicious refreshments were served by 
Wayne and Roberta Russell, Louis and 
Virginia F*yle and Keith and June Patzei

W.B. Cates introduced the guest 
speaker Sue Lovell and she showed us 
slides of her trip to Israel and it was very 
interesting. Some scenes were of the 
Dead Sea, King Herod's Palace, Roman 
Camp Ruins, the \hlley of the Shadow 
of Death and Bethlehem.

Secretary Francis Weathersbee read 
the minutes of the last meeting and they 
were approved. Treasurer Barbara 
Willis gave a financial report 

Harold Reese gave a report on the

Andrews Samboree. The club voted 
unanimously to accept Thomas Deshiro 
as a state director for 1995.

Wagon Master L.V. Assiter gave a re­
port on places to go and trail bosses for 
1995. Wagon Master Harold Norrell 
called on Claude Weathersbee and 
Boone Adams for reports on future 
campouts.

We were dismissed with J.W. 
Gilbreath leading Happy Trails.

Floydada Senior Citizen News
By Margarette Word 
FLOYDADA—Our center stays open 

till 4 p.m. Monday through Friday 
Saturday, Sept. 10, w ill be our 

monthly Senior Citizens luncheon. 
Please bring your favorite dish at 11 a.m.

Nails By Charlotte
at

yicki's Kustom Kuts
Tuesdays and Thursdays

Introducing Backscratchers Fiberglas
- Fiberglas Extensions - 45.00 - Full Set
- Fiberglas Silk-Wrap Overlays - 30.00 

Re-fills - 22.00 - Manicures -15.00 - Polish - 5.00

Charlotte Robertson 
Nail Technician 

111 California, Floydada

Call for an 
Appointment 

983-2439

Hand Knitted Sweaters
by Belle Pointe and Northern Isles

100% Cotton
Pullover Crews, Cardigans and Vests

Hayride, Noah's Ark, Basketball, Nautical, Floral, 
Patchwork Quilt Motifs - Limited Quantities

DALLAS COWBOY^
T-Shirts & Fitted Caps ^  

^  have just arrived!! ^

Hale's Department Store
112 E. California, Floydada

and enjoy a good meal, visiting and a 
program of several little children doing 
tumbling acts. Gayle Griffin has worked 
up a program for us. We will recognize 
those having a birthday in September

At Bill and Molly Stringer's home re­
cently they celebrated Molly's mothei; 
Opal Earp's 80th birthday. It was a 
"come and go" affair and about 100 
friends and relatives attended. There was 
one granddaughter from SaudiaArabia, 
one from Moscow, Russia, one from 
Melledin Columbia, SouthAmerica, one 
from Baltimore, Maryland, one from 
Cortland, Ohio, and and a grandson from 
Detroit, Michigan. All four of Opal's 
children were present, ten grandchildren 
and six great-grandchildren. All these 
people made a special trip to help Opal 
celebrate her biiihday.

Thank you for your donation toward 
the center's needs. Donations are com­
ing in and when we get enough money, 
we will start making improvements. If 
you would like to help, please send your 
donations to Hoydada Senior Citizens 
Fundraising Project, P.O. Box 573. We 
are a non-profit oiganization and we do 
need your help.

Mildred Fuqua has been ill recently 
and she wanted me to let you know that 
she really appreciated your prayers and 
cards, especially the card from the cen­
ter with so many signatures on iu

Please pray for those who are ill in 
our community.

Thought for the day: "God is our ref­
uge and strength, a very present help in 
trouble." -Psalms 46:1

MENU
September 12-16
Monday: Chicken enchiladas, mexi 

com and beans, stewed tomatoes, tossed 
salad, sugar cookies, milk/beverage 
choice

Tuesday: Meatloaf, mashed potatoes, 
broccoli w/cheese, wheat roll, dry jello 
salad, milk/beverage choice

Wednesday: Poik chop, lima beans, 
beet and onion salad, hot roll, pumpkin 
crunch, milk/beverage choice

Thursday: Roasted chicken, scallop 
potatoes, spinach, tossed salad, corn- 
bread, frosted cake, milk/beverage 
choice

Friday: Chicken fried steak, white 
gravy, mashed potatoes, mixed veg­
etables, tossed salad, wheat roll, fruited 
gelatin

SHAKLEE ^
983-5246 J

strengthening and enriching families 
through educational programs, leader­
ship development, and community ser­
vice. During 1993, it is estimated that 
TAFCE members across the state re­
turned more than $4,000,000 in volun­
teer time and money to their local com­
munities. TAFCE cooperates with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension Service to 
provide programs and leadership train­
ing that improves the quality of life for 
all Texas citizens. TAFCE membership 
across the state currently totals more 
than 11,750.

Featured speakers for the state meet­
ing will include Judy Weinkauf, Na­
tional Association for Family and Com­
munity Education president; Don Sea­
man, Director of the Texas Center for 
Adult Literacy and Learning at Texas 
A&M University; Dr. Lynne 
Thibodeaux, Assistant Director for 4-H 
and Youth; and Ida Dromgoole, Texas 
Associtaion of Extension Home Econo­
mists president.

Educational workshops will include: 
Focus on Family Literacy, Health, Chil­
dren and TV, the Environment, and 
Young Family Issues. Other activities 
included will be an International Year 
of the Family Global Fest, a closing ban­
quet, a Country Store, and a cultural arts 
exhibit.

FCE members from across the 20 
county. South Plains District have been 
working hard to make this the most suc­
cessful meeting ever. Floyd County 
members will serve as pages for the 
business sessions, will man the informa­
tion booth, will work at the Counu^y 
Store, were responsible for securing Red 
Cross personnel for the first aid station, 
and donated door prizes and country 
store items. Members also secured 
goody bag items from the following 
businesses: First National Bank of Floy­
dada, State Farm Insurance, Floyd 
County Farm Bureau and Script Print­
ing and Office Supply.

Gamma Nu 
Conclave meets

LOCKNEY-The Gamma Nu Con­
clave of Kappa Kappa Iota met Sept 3 
at the Main Street F îzza in Lockney for 
their monthly meeting.

Following lunch, the sorority presi­
dent Dana Pyle conducted the business 
meeting. Reports w oe given and plans 
for future meetings were made. 11

Those in attendance were Dana Pyle, 
Leslie Patterson, Jessica Davis, Sue 
Daniels and Marceen Lass.

Floyd County FCE members attend­
ing the state meeting as delegates will 
include Karen Millet Jonelle Fawver 
and Vivian Curtis. Other members as­
sisting with the stale meeting will be 
Maye Williams, Gladys Widener, Ruth 
Scou, Juaniu Pool, Imelda Ramsey, 
Erika, Laura and Rachel Millet and 
County Extension Agent Melissa Long.

Participating in the State CulturalArts 
Competition will be Juanita Pool, mem­
ber of the Harmony FCE Qub, who took

first place in the Fabric Painting Divi­
sion with her Stained Glass T-Shirt Cre­
ation. Juanita took first place at the Dis­
trict FCE Cultural Arts Competition and 
will compete with members from across 
the 12 districts throughout the state dur­
ing the annual State Convention Cultural 
Arts Exhibit. For more information 
about Family and Community Educa­
tion Clubs in Floyd County, call 983- 
2806 or come by ^ e  Floyd County Ex­
tension Office.

II Penseroso resumes meetings
By Victory Stewart 
LO CK NEY-M cm bers of the II 

Penseroso Jr. Study Club resumed meet­
ing recently after their summer break. 
Tami Wofford offered her lovely home 
for their first meeting, and members 
enjoyed delicious taco salad and snacks 
prepared by co-hostesses Lori 
Satterwhite and Ruth Reed.

President of the club. Heather Stowe, 
began the meeting by reviewing the 
club's constitution and by-laws. Then

members reviewed the activities and 
scheduled meetings for the yeai; and 
discussed their lemonade stand at Old 
Fashioned Saturday and the Fait 

Members present were Alice Carthel, 
Char Dowell, Shawnda Foster, Pam 
Fulton, Codee Owens, Ruth Reed, 
Shelley Roberts, Lori Satterwhite, 
Sammie Setliff, Robin Sherman, 
Michealle Stennett, Victory Stewart, 
Heather Stowe, Kim Teeter, and Tami 
Wofford. Visiting guest was Jessica 
Lloyd.

September 11

Remember those 
you love with 

a Telefloral 
Strawberry 

Teapot Bouquet

.TT-O450

Grandparm^
' Teapot Bougi^^

PARK FLORIST
312 W. Georgia, Floydada 983-2867

Monday-Friday: 830  -  530 Saturday: 830  -  1230

W.J. Mangold Memorial Hospital 
is pleased to announce their new arrivals!
DAISEY, daughter of Juan Fidensio and Maria de Jusus Guerrero, was bom at 2:22 a.m. on July 
30, 1994. She weighed 7 lbs. and 1 oz. Grandparents are Esperanza and Jesus Chavez of 
Plainview and Jose Antonio and Faye Guerrero of Olton.

GRACIELA EDELIN, daughter of Esperidion and Victoria Cevera of Floydada, was bom 
August 11,1994 at 2:58 a.m. She weighed 3 lbs. and 15 ozs. Grandparents are Espiridion and 
Maria Gradela Cervera of Floydada and Pedro Reyes and Marin Mata of Saragosa, Mexico.

ELIZABETH ERIN, daughter of Raul and Dianah Ascencio of Lockney, was bom at 10:02 p.m. 
on August 12,1994. She weighed 7 lbs. and 4 ozs. Grandparents are Raul Sr. and Felisitas 
Ascencio of South Plains and Juanita Coronado of Floydada and the late Ramon Coronado.

RENE, son of Rene and Sylvia Guerrero of Lockney, was bom August 16,1994 at 12:21 p.m. 
He weighed 5 lbs and 5 ozs. Grandparents are Tomas and Eudelia Rendon of Lockney and 
Ruben and Adelina Guerrero of Lockney.

ANTHONY ALBERT, son of Albert and Nora Garza of Floydada, was bom August 18,1994 
at 6:52 p.m. He weighed 6 lbs and 10 1/2 ozs. Grandparents are Jesse and Janie Dominguez 
of Abernathy and Oscar and Cande Garza of Floydada.

FERNANDO JR., son of Fernando and Anita Zavala of Ralls, was bom August 21,1994 at 8:06 
p.m. He weighed 5 lbs. and 15 ozs. Grandparents are Marcilino and Margarita Baiz of Ralls 
and Pedro and Maria Zavala of Ralls.

ALLEN COLE, son of Brenda Moseley and Troy Jackson of Quitaque, was bom August 22, 
1994. He weighed 8 lbs. and 12 ozs. Grandparents are Charlene Randell of Turkey and the late 
Marvin Randell; and Henry Jackson and Zola Jackson of Quitaque.

KODIE REAGAN, daughter of Scott and Susan Saul of Quitaque, was bom August 25,1994 
at 8:33 p.m. She weighed 7 lbs and 13 ozs. Grandparents are Bobby and Glenda Pinner of 
Lockney and Jim and Barbara Saul of Qxiitaque.

------------W .J .------------
ANGOL
MEMORIAL HOSPITAL.

320 North Main, Lockney (806) 652-3373
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SIDERS'
SIDELINES

By Kerry Siders, CEA-Ag

Judge Bill Hardin signs Farm and Ranch Safety and Health Week Proclama' 
tion as Mark McCormick, President of the Floyd County Farm Bureau, looks 
on. Staff Photo

PROCLAMATION
by the

COUNTY JUDGE OF FLOYD COUINTY

To all to whom these presents shall come:
I, William D. Hardin, County Judge of Floyd County do hereby declare the 

week of September 18-24,1994 as Farm and Ranch Safety and Health Week in 
Floyd County, for the following reasons:

WHEREAS, this being the 51st anniversary of the observance of farm and ranch 
safety and health, emphasis is placed on better technology safe work practices and 
education as is also being proclaimed by the governor and,

WHEREAS, the 1994 theme, "Safety and Health . . .  A Way of Life" calls 
attention to the fact that everyone in America should be concerned about agricul­
tural production and its longevity and strength in the global arena. Each farmer 
and rancher now feeds nearly 130 persons and eme^ing technologies indicate that 
our future looks bright for expanding this milestone.

THEREFORE, every U.S. citizen should pause a moment during this week of 
our 51 St anniversary, and recognize the dedication of our farmers and ranchers, 
daily, toward strengthening the welfare of our great nation.Their emotional, eco­
nomic and environmental hardships should not go unnoticed.

THUS, the National Safety Council, the Texas Safety Association, the Ibxas 
Department of Agriculture, theTbxas Farm and Ranch Safety Council, and others, 
w i^  to recognize all agriculturists, with special emphasis to our safety specialists 
and to those farms and ranches seeking and following their advice for a s^er farm­
ing community by posting a policy statement and safety rules for your operation, 
do a hazard hunt regularly and s e ^  and use meaningful educational programs.

THEREFORE, I uige everyone to take the necessary precautions for their own 
safety as well as the safety of others on and o f  the job. I urge our leaders in 
agriculture to improve areas of safety and health efforts by example.

SIGNED: WiUiam D. Hardin 
COUNTY JUDGE

The following information was taken 
in part from the High Plains Cotton Jouf 
nal.

The extreme earliness of the 1994 
cotton crop Justiiles even greater use of 
harvest aids than in 1993, when approxi­
mately 75% of the acreage received 
some tieatmenL However; the extremely 
low yields in many dryland fields will 
make it difficult to spend additional 
money on these fields. Before leaving a 
dryland crop in the field to wait on a 
killing freeze, consider the benefits of 
the use of harvest aids on low yielding 
dryland cotton: early harvest, reduced 
weathering loss, increased water reten­
tion for planting in 1995.

We have three techniques to deter­
mine when we can apply harvest aids 
and still retain maximum yield: seed and 
lint inspection with a sharp knife. Nodes 
Above Cracked Boll (NACB), and per­
cent open boll.

Cutting into green bolls with a sharp 
knife is a highly accurate method to as­
sess maturity. Inspect the cut cross sec­
tion of seeds looldng for signs of matu­
rity: no jelly left in the seed, no glisten­
ing of free water in the boll, cotyledons 
yellow to tan, a darker ring around the 
cut seed due to the darker seed coat than 
the cotyledons.

To use the NACB technique, walk into

4 parts of a field, 10 plants with a first 
position cracked boll. Acracked boll has 
some visible lint, but no more than half 
open. When all the green bolls are within 
3 nodes of the cracked boll that field will 
reach 100% maturity and waiting longer 
to apply a harvest aid will not increase 
lint weight

Applying a defoliant (not desiccant) 
when the percent open bolls reach 60% 
has been a standard technique across the 
Belt, for a desiccant 80% is commonly 
used.

Start the harvest season with reduced 
rates of material, the warm weather and 
short stature of these early fields should 
reduce the amount of defoliant and boll 
opener needed. However; this same wa­
ter stress has increased the waxiness of 
the leaf surface (the cuticle) and higher 
rates of surfactants may be beneficial.

The options listed in the table are only 
starting points for producers to consider 
as they build a successful program for 
1994, and should not be taken as a blan­
ket recommendation. Several other ma­
terials that producers have reported suc­
cess with include: Harvade, Accelerate 
and Sodium Chlorate.

For more information, contact Kerry 
Siders at the Tbxas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service in Floyd County.

'Y o u 're  p u l in g  
w ith  d ea th  . . .

. . .  when you shoot at 
game while electrical fixtures 
are |n your line of fire.

Custom
Pesticide
Application

High Plains Harvest-aid Decision Table (notiiitre«tinentsarecqu»ay effective)
Crop ConditkHi

Sbon, 12 to 14 in. mil 
Yield, up to 400 lb«/*c

y

Medium, 15 lo 18 in. ttU 
Yield, 500-800 Ibe/ac

Tall. 20 to 24 inebet tall 
Yield. 8004 Iba/ac

Ranki (21 lo 36 to tall) 
Yield, 8004 Iba/ac

Dry, Max Tcm p>80
(4*3 days after traaUMal)

Cyclooe (810160s)*'

Cyckme - *  Cyclone 
(4 to 8 16 to 32ox*̂ >

Cyclone 4 Def/Fokx 
(6 to 10 4 8 10 12oz)

Cyclooe Cyclooe 
(4 10 8 16 to 32os total)

Prep 4  Def/Fotes 
(8 to 16 4 8 to 16 oe)

Cyclone 4  Qutckpick 
<1610 24 4 l6to24oz)

Prep 4  Def/Folex 
(16 4 8 to 16 oa)

Dry, Max Temp <75
(^3 day» aflar traatMot)

Cyclooe (8 to l6oz)*'

Cyclooe —» Cyclooe 
(8 to 12 16 K) 32oc*^)

Cyclooe 4  Def/Folex 
(8 to 12 4  8 to l2os)

C ycloaeC yclooe 
(6 to 8 —k 16 to 32ox total)

Wet
(^3 dsyi after trcMOMat)

Cyclone (8 to 16oz)*'

Cyclone -4  Cyck»e 
(«to 12 -*  1610 32*')

Cyclooe + Ouickiiick** 
(16 to 24 4 16 to 24os)

Prep 4 Def/Folex 
(16 1021*^ 4  16 os)

Cyckme 4  ()uickpick 
(16 to 24 4  16to24oz>

Prep 4  Def/Folex 
(2 1*’ + 16m )

Prep 4 Dropp 
(16 os 4  0.1 pounds)

Prep 4 Def/Folex 
(16 4  16 oz)

Prep 4  Dropp
(21 oz 4 O.IS pounds)

Prep 4  Dropp 
<!6 oz 4  0.1 pountb)

Prep 4  Def/Fokx ^  
(21 I0 26** + 16 m )

Prep 4 Dropp
(21 02 4  0.15 pounds)

Cyckme ^  Cyclooe 
(6 to 10 -^  16 to 3202)

Prep 4 Def/Fotex 
(21*^ 4 16oz)

Cyclooe 4  Quickpick 
(16 to 24 4  16lo24oz)

Prep 4  Def/Fokx 
(21 to 28 4  16 oz)

Def/Fokx 4  Dropp '<
(8 02 4 0.1_pou&^)____ _ T

Prep 4 Dropp 
(16 02 4  0.1 pounds)

Pt8|^ if Dcf/F(dex S

(21 to 32 4  16 oz) I

Prep 4 Dropp
(21 02 4 O.tS pourtds)

Larry Ferguson
Home.......... 983-3820
Mobile.___ 983-1820

IRRIGATORS, INC
LINDAN MORRIS
Lockney - 652-2270  

Office - 652-2304  
M obile - 293-6070

JIM  BOYDSTUN
Ralls - 253-3175 

M obile - 657-7823

H E A LT H
INSURANCE

tohoippay 
hoaptiai-aurpical biiia

C A LL  
Nicnc LONG 

I 983-3441
Uwtwsi awtOMMat

Submerslhk* Turhiiu*

LA W ’S PUMP 
SERVICE

I.KON I.A W , Owner 
Silverlon

Day IMioiie Night riione 
sivZOfil 82.1-21S8

Windmills
House \1ells Irrigation Wells

*1 Use 00 coQoo with namrsl kafsbed. These high m et can cauae freen, healthy ksves to i t i^
•2 No mwe than 32 ounces of Cyclone nuy be applied in any one icaaoo. The need for -  and m e of -  Cyclooe m a second applicatm 
will depend on the amouM of freen ksves remaining
•3 Besides crop matunty, the activity of Prep is effected by rate and lemperinire Under cookr cooditiom, boll openmf can be en­
hanced by tnereuing the rate
*4 Tbit combinattoo at these rates is a desiccating treatment, although scene kaf drop msy occur

Make plans to enter your prize winning exhibit 
in the Floyd County Fair

We Service All Brands of Pivot Sprinklers 
and We Have Parts In Stock.

Invest in the future with 
a Zimmatic Center Pivot.

PRODUCER'S
CO-OPERATIVE

ELEVATOR
983-2821 - FLO YDADA  

983-3770 - DO UG H ERTY

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK OF FLOYDADAa

FLOYDADA 983-3717

RUSSELL’S
EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY

R u s s e i r s

F^LOYDADA 983-3751

FLOYDADA 
CO-OPERATIVE GINS[CO OP]

f l o y d a i 983-3717

RHODERICK IRRIGATION 
and ADAMS WELL SERVICE

• Center Pivots • Sales & Service Z I M M A T I C  
•Service All Brands Center Pivots Raining Champloi^
• Irrigation Pipeline Installation

A fitri-ln iec t. In c .

PROVEN

Economical 
Reliable 
Accurate 

■ Portable 
SAFE

From the F l/M P  through the 
PIPELINE Xo the PIVOT, 

Call Us For Your 
TURNKEY JOB

UNDERGROUND PIPELINE »Installed & Repaired

All sizes and kinds of pipe installed! 
Irrigation or Gas

Now Available - 20,000 hour Pivot Light.
We Service ALL Brands of Pivot Sprinklers.

OUT OF TOWN CALL 1-800-878-2584
823-2139 

Silverton, Texas
983-5003 , 

Floydada, Texas
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This Week's 
Announcements

AMERICAN CANCER SOCIETY 
American Cancer Society, Floyd 

County Unit, will meet Monday, SepL 
12, at 5 p.m. in the community room of 
the Fust National Bank in Floydada. All 
members are urged to be present for this 
fust fall meeting.

SCOUT SHIRTS NEEDED 
Cub Scout Pack 357 needs shins. If 

you have a Cub Scout shin you would 
like to donate or sell, please call Jimmy 
McGaugh, Cub Master at 983-2603.

HORSELESS RODEO 
Silver Spurs 4-H Horse Club will be 

sponsoring a Horseless Rodeo on Sat­
urday, Sept. 17, beginning at 4 p.m. For 
more information, call Debbie Shatley 
at 652-3135 or Marcia Phillips at 652- 
2676.

4-H INFORMATION 
AND SIGN UP NIGHT 
Floydada 4-H will host a 4-H Family 

Information and Sign Up Night on Mon­
day, Sept. 12, at the Duncan Elemen­
tary Cafeteria from 7:00 to 8:00 p.m. 
Interested students ages 9-19 and par­
ents are invited to attend.

BAND CALENDAR SALES 
Floydada Band students will be tak­

ing Community Band Calendar orders 
on Monday, Sept. 12. Anyone wishing 
to order a band calendar who is not con­
tacted by a band student, may call Bill 
Harbin at 983-2814 or Charlene Brown 
at 983-2618.

FLOYDADA BAND BOOSTERS
Floydada Band Boosters will meet in 

the Band Hall Monday, SepL 12, at 7:00 
p.m. The Band Boosters and band stu­
dents will have a hamburger cookout 
after the calender sales. All band par­
ents and boosters are urged to attend.

LOCKNEY SCHOOL NIGHT 
FOR SCOUTING 
Lockney School Night for Scouting 

will be at 7 p.m. Monday, SepL 12, in 
the Lockney Elementary School Cafete­
ria. Everyone wishing to sign up for 
scouting this year should come and bring 
a parent or guardian.

QUEENS' CONTEST
APPLICATIONS
Applications for the Little Miss and 

Miss Floyd County Pageant at the Floyd 
County Fair can be picked up at Hale's 
Department Store in Floydada or from 
Shelia Poole in Lockney.

LAMAZE CLASSES
WJ. Mangold Memorial Hospital will 

offer Lamaze Childbirth Classes start­
ing Thursday, Sept. 8. Classes will meet 
each Thursday for seven weeks from 
7:00 to 9:30 p.m. at the First Baptist 
Church in Lockney. To register call 
Molly Stringer, R.N., at 983-5854.

BLOOD PRESSURE CLINIC
Free blood pressure clinic is held in 

the community room of the First Na­
tional Bank in Floydada everyTuesday 
from 9 a.m. to 11 a.m. Everyone is wel­
come.

VETERANS OFHCER
Veterans Service Officer Ralph Jack- 

son is available in the county courtroom 
on Friday afternoons from 1:00 to 5:00 
p.m.

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
Alcoholics Anonymous andAl-Anons 

meet each Tuesday night at 8:00 p.m. 
Anyone wanting the loving fellowship 
of men and women who can share their 
experience, strength and hope are wel­
come. Meetings are held in the County 
Extension Building, at the north end of 
the building. Anyone interested may call 
983-3635 or 652-3546.

SALVATION ARMY
The Lockney Salvation Army is in 

need of donations. Clothes, shoes and 
other items are needed. Help is needed 
in the community.

WEATHER
Courtesy of Energas 

DATE HIGH LOW
Aug. 31 85 70
SepL 1 73 66
SepL 2 86 66
SepL 3 90 68
SepL 4 94 67
SepL 5 86 72
SepL 6 84 66

4-H to host Family Night
—From Melissa Long, CEA-HE 
FLOYDADA-Floydada 4-H Club 

will host a 4-H Family Information and 
Sign up Night on Monday, SepL 12, at 
the Duncan Elementary C^eteria from 
7:00 p.m. to 8:00 pm . A short program 
on 4-H and educational opportunities 

' available to all students from ages 9 to 
19 will be given. Interested parents and 
students are invited to attend.

4-H is the nation's laigest youth oiga- 
nization with a member of 17,000 on the 
South Plains, 450,000 in Texas, and 5

FARM BUREAU SPONSORS FIR E M A N -(L -R ) M ark  M cC orm ick, 
p resident of Floyd County Farm  Bureau, presented  V olunteer F ire­
man Bobby W elborn w ith a check to cover expenses to  a recen t tra in ­
ing school for firem en, sponsored by Texas A&M . Every year. Farm  
B ureau pays the expenses for one firem an to a ttend  the school.

S taff Photo

Silver Spurs plan Horseless Rodeo
By Jurahee Jones
Reporter
FLOYDADA—The Silver Spurs 4-H 

Horse Club met September 5 in the 
home of Debbie Shatley. Plans were fi­
nalized for the Horseless Rodeo which 
is planned for SepL 17 during the Floyd 
County Fair in Lockney.

There will be four separate age divi­
sions: 4 to 6 year olds; 7 to 9 year olds; 
10 to 13 year olds; and 14 to 17 year 
olds.

The seven events will include: Stick 
Horse Barrel Race (stick horses will be 
furnished); Steer Roping; Calf Roping 
(ropes furnished); Goat Ribbon 
Race; Goat Dressing; and Boot Race.

Cost will be $2.00 per enuy and 
awards will be given.

For more inform ation on the 
Horseless Rodeo call Debbie Shatley at 
652-3135 or Marcia Phillips at 652- 
2676.

During the meeting, Kerry Siders 
gave some handouts to the officers 
which explained what their duties are. 
Debbie encouraged the kids to earn 
enough points to get a 4-H jackeL

The October 3 meeting will be held 
in the home of Jurahee Jones.

Those present were Amy Davis, Kacie 
Young, Tyler Phillips, Laura Lote, 
Valerie Hartline, Nicole Hartline and 
Christopher Hartline.

Ogden gives electrical safety 
tips to Floydada 4-H Club

By Laura Dean
FLOYDADA—Hiesday, Aug. 30, the 

Floydada 4-H Club held its first 4-H 
meeting of the 1994 school year There

were 57 total in attendance.
The meeting was called to order by 

President Regina Ware. The program, 
given by Larry Ogden, c o v e rt electri­

cal safety tips. Following thaL we had 
recreation and refreshments rex’ every­
one.

The meeting was then adjourned by 
Regina Ware, and that was the closing 
of the club's first meeting. The next 
meeting will be held SepL 27, at 6:30 
p.m. at the Massie Activity Center 
(MAC).

Better Business Bureau warns of work-at-home companies
By Nan Campbell, President 
We have been receiving an unusual 

number of calls on a company out of 
Pocatello, Idaho, called AD V A ^A G E 
MARKETING, which according to the 
Idaho Falls BBB falls into the category 
of woik at home companies.

The company claiins they are an ad­
vertising and marketing agency The 
company places work at home ads in 
newspapers oETering a guide containing 
listings of companies that offer oppor­
tunities for making money from the 
home. The guide costs $29 plus $5.00 
shipping and handling.

The BBB in Idaho repmis that the 
company has been responsive to any 
complaints brought to their attention 
however the company has a pattern of

Support your local
SMERGENCYltolCALSERVlCBSi
Donatl<HU A Memorials Appreciated

FLOYDADA EMS
P .6 . Box 373, Floydada^ Tx, 79235

using the BBB as a reference in its mar­
keting. Use of the Bureau name is pro­
hibited.

BBBs across the country routinely 
advise potential homeworkers to be 
aware that work at home promotions 
seldom offer salaried employmenL Give 
us a call at 763-0459 and request "Ups 
on Work-At-Home Schemes."

Salespersons who peddle books of 
coupons for only $20 or $30 will claim 
that the coupons are good for merchan­
dise and services valued at thousands of 
dollars. However, before you start clip­
ping your way to savings, make sure 
you'll get the deal that is promised.

Coupon books are typically designed, 
developed and sold by commercial mar­
keting companies. The company enters 
a community and encourages merchants 
to participate by promising them new 
customers and increased business from 
buyers who will use their coupons.

To sell their product to the public, prth 
moters claim the books have a retail

value equal to the maximum possible 
value of all the coupons combinkl. Cou­

pon books can represent a real value, and 
at the same time introduce you to new

Come and Enjoy Ilie
Floyd County Fair

September 15-17

Card of Thanks

CONSUMERS FUEL 
ASSOCIATION of LOCKNEY
^ --------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Oil Products, Batteries & Accessories
Tires (Good Year, Lee)

Service Truck Available for Repair 
__—--------------------------------------------------

OPEN: Monday - Friday 6:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Saturday 6:30 a.m. • Noon

111 E. Shubert 652-3336

We would like to thank everyone who has 
helped us during Linda’s recent hospital 
stay. The flowers, cards, calls, and food were 
really appreciated. We couldn’thavemade it 
through the last month without each of you.

Mike and Linda Hinsley 
9-8p

Thank you so much to all our friends who 
have shown us so much encouragement in 
the past weeks, for our granddaughter, for 
Claude having surgery, and for your love and 
concern at the death of my brother. You all 
have helped us through some difficult days 
in sll of your sweet ways. We love each of 
you and know the Lord is going to bless your 
lives for such kindness as you have shown 
us.

Our love,
Claude and Frances Weathersbee

9-8p

Thank you for your concern, calls, food, 
visits, and cards while I was in the hospital 
and recovering at home. God bless you all.

Adolfo Garcia and Family 
9-8c

N E W  heam̂  md
that’s almost invisible.

Worn deep in the auditory canal, the new Deep Canal Aid 
is the smallest, deepest fitting hearing aid ever developed. A 
small, permanently attached clear cord allows you to easily 
remove the instrument at your convenience. We are offering 
I  ■ ■ ’[ the Deep Canal Hearing Aid on a FREE

30-day trial. Call for an appointment to 
have a hearing evaluation and to have your 
ear canal measured to see if you are a 
candidate for this style instalment:
1 -800-828-0722. Offer expiree 9/21/94

/
A Representative will be 
at the Caprock Hospital 
in Floydada on Sept 19

H E A M M 6  « 6  

C E N T S " .

5303 50lh St 
Lubbock, TX 

1-800-828-0722

million nationwide. Project areas range 
from safety to family life education, and 
conservation of natural resources. 4-H 
encourages family involvement and 
suesses leadership and community ser­
vice as important aspects for an effec­
tive 4-H careec

4-H is the Youth Development phase 
of the Texas Agricultural Extension Se^ 
vice in Floyd County. For more infor­
mation call 983-2806 or go by the 
County Extension Office in the Court­
house Agricultural Building on the 
Courthouse Square.

stores or restaurants. BuL be wary of 
exa^erated or misleading claims, ask 
to look through the book before you 
purchase, and check them out with your 
BBB first - caU 763-0459.

It is with great appreciation that we send 
thanks to everyone who ministered to us 
during the long suffering and ultimate death 
of our loved one. Bill Staniforth. The visits, 
food, flowers, and gifts to charities would 
have made Bill so proud. We especially 
thank the ones who contributed to the lovely 
memorial service and the following recep­
tion. To each of you, we send our lincerest 
thanks, deepest love, and gratefiil apprecia- 
d o a .

God bless you, 
Frances and Billy Staniforth 

Sarah and Graham Staniforth 
Sara and Doug Fryman 

and Trey and Laura 
9-8c

Obituaries
MAX MARBLE
Services for Max Marble, 53, of Pla- 

inview were at 2 p.m. Saturday, SepL 3, 
in the chapel of the First Baptist Church 
in Plainview. Officiating was Dn Travis 
Halt, pastor. Burial was in Lockney 
Cemetery by Lemons Funeral Home of 
Plainview.

Mr. M arble died at 12:40 p.m. 
Wednesday, Aug. 31,1994, in Lubbock's 
University Medical Centet

He was bom on March 14, 1941 on 
the family farm east of Lockney. He 
grew up on the family farm, where he 
lived, attended school and farmed until 
moving to Hart in 1970. He also fanned 
on the Nanny Pasture.

He married Evelyn Linderman on 
Nov. 9,1980 in San Antonio and moved 
to Plainview in 1987.

He was a member of the First Baptist 
Church of Plainview and a former mem­
ber of the Hart First Baptist Church. He 
was a member of the Hart Lions Club. 
He had been recognized as an outstand­
ing farmer, placing first in the Holland 
Com Growers Association in 1983 and 
had also received high yield awards in 
wheat and soybean production.

Survivors include his wife, Evelyn; 
three sons, Larry Marble of Plainview, 
Marlin Marble of Grand Island, Neb., 
and Jeff Rogers of Kress; a daughter 
Zenita Rowland of Hart; his mothei; 
Mrs. Hugh (Ealhyl) Marble of Plain- 
view; a sister, Mary Ann Slair of Plain- 
view; and eight grandchildren.

LESLIE SURGINER
Graveside services for Leslie 

Surginer, 90, of New Bern, N.C., were 
held at 10:30 a.m. Friday, SepL 2, at 
Highland Memorial Park in Weslaco, 
Texas, with Dc Leslie Mills, pastor of 
the First Bt^jtist Church ofWeslaco, of­
ficiating. Arrangements were by 
McCaleb Funeral Home in Weslaco.

Mr. Surginer died Friday, Aug. 26, 
1994, at Britthaven.

He was bom January 11,1904 to Isaac 
Carr and Lena Mae Snodgrass Surginer. 
His grandparents, Columbus and Mary 
Cintha Surginer settled in Floyd County 
in 1896.

He graduated from Floydada High 
School and received his B.B.S. degree 
from South Texas College and a degree 
from the University of Texas at Austin 
and became a certified public accoun­
tant. He was chief accountant of Farm 
Credit Administration, Deputy Regional 
Director of Kansas City Regional Army 
Audit Agency. Assistant Director of 
Defense Accounting and Auditing Di­
vision of the United States General Ac­
counting office. Chief Accounting and 
Auditing Divisions, and Comptroller 
and Director of Borrowers Financial 
Management Division of the Rural Elec­
trification Administration during his 
government careen

He also was a colleague to subcom­
mittee Staff Experts on Accounting Na­
tional Association Regulatory Utility 
Commissioners, member of the Inter­
agency Regulatory Accounts Commit­
tee, and member of the American Insti-

The Floydada Band and Band Boostera 
wish to thank the Lockney emergency medi­
cal personnel and the personnel at W. J. 
Mangold Memorial Hospital for their kind 
response when two of our students suc­
cumbed to the heat and excitement during 
the Lockney vs. Floydada football game. 
The students are fine now, thanks in large 
part to the professional, courteous care 
which they received from you. Once again, 
ourthanksi

9-8c

We would like to thank thecommimity for 
their kindness dueing our time of sorrow and 
grief at the loss of our beloved son, brother, 
husband and father, David. The prayers and 
support of a small community have once 
again out shone itself. We love David dearly 
and will always remember everything he has 
done and all he left behind, but we must 
always remember he is in a better place than 
anyone of us can even dream of. All he ever 
wanted was what was best for his family and 
the community.

Thank you all once again. 
The Balderas Family 

9-8c

H ave a good week!

For Your Insurance

Auto 
Home 
Life 

Health 
Disability 

Farm/Ranch 
Boats 
RV's

Retirement 
Renters 
Church

See.. .
NICK LONG 
INSURANCE

201 W. California 
Floydada, Texas 
(806) 983-3441

tute of Certified Public Accountants.
Mr. Surginer was the recipient of the 

Superior Service Award from the United 
State Department of Agriculture, the 
Secretaries Management Improvement 
Award and the Federal Accountants As­
sociation of Distinguished Leadership 
Award. He retired in1972 from his gov­
ernment career and later became con­
sultant to Cooper and Cyberands and the 
National Utilities Cooperative Finance 
Corporation.

He was a Mason, a member of the 
Methodist Church, member of the Uni­
versity of Texas System Chancellors 
Council, the Littlefield Society, and 
member of the Dunes Golf and Beach 
Club.

Mr. Suiginer and his family gave the 
C. Surginer and Son Hardware building, 
located north of the Floyd County Court­
house, as a permanent home for the 
Floyd County Historical Museum. Later 
he gave the building east of the museum 
as an addition.

Survivors include his wife, Dorothy 
of New Bern, N.C.; two daughters. 
Gloria M. Gonyeo and Donna M. HunL 
both of Rochester, N.Y.; six grandchil­
dren; and three great-grandchildren.

THOMAS GLEN WILLIAMS
Funeral services for Thomas Glen 

Williams, 72, of Lubbock were at 10:30 
a.m. Thursday, SepL 1, in Resthaven 
Funeral Home Chapel with the Rev Irv­
ing Looney, a retired Baptist minister 
officiating. Burial was in Resthaven 
Memorial Paric.

Mr. Williams died Monday, Aug. 29, 
1994, in Sl Mary Plaza.

He was bom on May 10. 1922, in 
Lockney. He served with the U.S. Ma­
rine Corps during World War II and was 
a member of the Masonic Lodge and the 
Baptist church.

He married Maigie L. West on Jan. 
31.1953 in Clovis. N.M.

Survivors include his wife; two broth­
ers, Calvin Williams of Hale Center and 
Clifton Williams of Las Vegas, Nev.; 
three sisters, Irene Sinclair and Thelma 
Williams, both of Plainview, and Alta 
Trussell of Wcatherfo-d; three grandchil­
dren; and four great-grandchildren.

A daughter, Dora Mae Herring, died 
OcL 14,1984.

Advertisement
HEARING TESTS SET 
FOR SENIOR CITIZEN 
CENTERS
Electronic Hearing Test to Determine if 
amplification would be beneficial to 
you, will be given this week in Lockney 
and Flovdada.

TH U RSD A Y, S ep tem ber 8 • 
Floydada Senior Citizens Building: 
10:00 a.m. -12  noon.

TUEISDAY, September 13 • Lock­
ney Senior Citizen Center, 10:00 a.m.

1:00 p jn .

J. Wampler, Hearing Instrument Spe­
cialist, will be at the SenioiCiiizens 
Centers to perform the tesL

We offer new fittings, and repairs on all 
brands of hearing aids.

The FREE hearing test will be given 
THURSDAY, September 8 at the 
Floydada Senior Citizen Building, 301 
E. Georgia, from 10:00 a.m. to 12:00 
noon and TUESDAY, September 13 at 
the Lockney Senior Citizens Center, 
118 W. College 13 from 10:00-1:00.
If you arc unable to come into the Senior 
Citizen Centers please call for an in 
home service.

WAMPLER HEARING 
AID SERVICES

3502 Slide Road A-16 
Lubbock, Texas, 79414 

1-800-687-1995
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JANICE AND JERREL BRASHEAR

Recording artists appearing at 
Grace Fellowship September 11

Welcome Home recording artists, 
Janice and Jerrel Brasheai; are coming 
to Grace Fellowship Church in Lockney 
on Sunday, Sept, 11, to present a con­
cert of Southern Gospel and Christian 
Country music. The Brashears have 
sung all over the United States, parts of 
Canada, and Jamaica. They have sung 
in churches, both small and large, high 
school and civic auditoriums, electric

Floydada Nursing 
Home Happenings
By Jane Martinez 
Activity Director
FLOYDADA-I would like to start by 

saying I am the new Activity Director 
here at the Hoydada Nursing Home. I 
am very happy to be a part of the nurs­
ing home. I am hoping to be a part of 
the residents and their families as well.

I would also like to say that I would 
be happy if we could get more volun­
teers in the home. Our residents would 
really enjoy seeing the old faces and also 
some new ones.

As for nursing home happenings we 
have Grandparents Day, SepL IT, Resi­
dents Birthday Party, Sept IS, at 2:30 
p.m.; National Housekeepers Week, 
Sept. 11-17; and on SepL 21 at 12 noon 
we will have the Family Picnic. On SepL 
29, at 9 a.m. we will taking a trip to 
the South Plains Fair in Lubbock for 
Senior Citizens Day activities.

We would also l^ e  to wish a Happy 
Birthday to Ottis Johnson, Bernice 
Robison, Robert Holt, Fannie McConic 
and Emma Bearden. They are celebrat­
ing their birthdays this month of Sep­
tember.

We welcome Neddie Childress, Faye 
Stringer and Lurene Gee as our new resi­
dents.

Hope everyone can come and visit us. 
We will enjoy your company. Until next 
time, see yal

coops, county and state fairs, and also 
the World's Fair. They have sung sev­
eral times at the National Quartet Con­
vention, Nashville, Tennessee.

They are regulars on the Sing Out 
America nationally televised cable pro­
gram, seen on the Acts Network, as well 
as the Willie Williams Gospel TV pro­
gram, "Southern Gospel Time."

They have hosted the Southwest Fes­
tival of Gospel Music in Phoenix, Ari­
zona. for 15 years, but in 1994 two other 
cities in Arizona, three in Texas and one 
in New Mexico will take part in this 
Festival.

Jerrel has a monthly article in the na­
tional publication. The Singing News, 
"Western Trails Review", and an article 
in the Voice, "Just West of Here,"

Jerrel Brashear has been singing gos­
pel music for 40 years, but he started 
the Brashears 21 years ago. The 
Brashears and Grace Fellowship Church 
invite everyone to come and be a part 
of this concert, which is scheduled to 
begin at 11 a.m. A free will offering will 
be taken.

Grace Fellowship Church is located 
at 211 N. Main in Lockney.

—  The Perfect Street o f Shops —

COMING TO
LUBBOCK

Lubbock Momorial Civic Cantor 
1 SOI Sixth Strsot at Ava. Q

S E P TE M B E R 16,17 ,18
Fri. 4-9 • Sat. 9-8 • Sun. 11-5 

Folk Art • Decorating • Appcurel
210-997-CPS-4 
P.O. D raw er E 

F rederickaburg, TX 78624

* 1 1

Kathleen Sullivan
T v e  lost 20 pounds thanks to SuperstartI It got 

me started and gave me the confidence to keep going.

GUARANTEED!
Join a Woicjhf Watchers Community Meeting 
and LOSE at least 8 POUNDS in 7 weeks 

or your next 8 week series is FREE!*

It you call Weight Watchers today 
you’ll ba able to start losing weight 
almost Immediately.

You’ll eat delicious, easy-to-prepare 
meals from a selection of more than 70 
great recipes. And you’ll get all the 
support and encouragement you need 
to lose weight.

That’s the secret to Weight Watchers 
SuperstartI program. It's the perfect 
plan for pe<x>leln a hurry to start losing 
weight and for people who don't want to 
sacrtflca their favorite foods. _______

All you have to do Is join a Weight 
Watchers Community Meeting. In seven 
week's time If you haven't lost at least 8 
pounds, youll get your next 8-week 
series free. It's 
that easy.

This is a limited 
time offer for new 
enrollments only.
So join today.

Would you like this program in 
Lockney or Floydada?

Help Supcrslart a new group in your town! 
Call and tell us if you are interested 

or for more information.

•a»nd «t iMtt 7 out of th« 0 mooWngt It you hovt Iom  thon B )m  to \om . moo you 
your rtoxt 0 wook ooriot lofroo

individual »«algM loaa, m a ln w n a n ^  Till? J?!5Z 
naw arroSmanli at loeatlon H y d  trw  
1Q/2B/B4 only Cannot ba comblnad wito a n y o ^  
e i8 S 4  WaigM Waleham Intamabonal, •*'*_. **•
vyEOHT WATCHERS tradamafV All tlQMi raaantod

and to complaw program plannoia and 
'll loaa al laaal lhal much, or

1 -800-651 -6000

Floyd County Church Directory
AIKEN BAPTIST CHURCH

Sunday School.............KkOO a.m.
Morning Worship........  11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship.............6:00 p jn.
Wednesday:

Bible Study...............7:30 pjn.
* « * * e

APOSENTO ALTO 
DE PENTECOSTAL 
203 SE 2nd & College 

Lockney 652-2204
Chon ^pulveda. Pastor 

Wednesday Evening. . . .  7:30 p.m.
Sunday School........................10:00 a.m.
Sunday Worship...............3:00 p.m.

*****
BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 

810 S. 3rd, Floydada 
Darwin Robinson, Pastor 

Sunday:
Sunday School........ 10:00 a.m.

Morning Worship. . . .  10:45 a.m.
Prayer Meeting............ 6:00 p.m.
Evening Service...........6:30 p.m.

Wednesday:
Evening Services........8:00 p.m.

CALVARY 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Claude Porter, Pastor

Sunday School......................... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship......... 11:00 a.m.
Bible Study...............................6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship............. 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening____7:00 p.m.

CARR’S CHAPEL
Service Every Sunday:

Morning Worship. . . .  9:00 a.m.
Sunday School........ 10:30 a.m.

No Evening Services 
*****

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
West College & Third, 

Lockney
Frank Duckworth, Evangelist

Morning Wmship........... 10:30 am .
Evening Worship..............5:30 p.m.
Wednesday Service.......... 8:00 p.m.

*****
CITY PARK 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Floydada

Gene McCarty, Minister 
Sunday:

Bible Study.......................... 9:30 am.
Morning Worship.. . .  10:30 am. 
Evening Worship. . . .  6:00 pjn. 

Wednesday:
Bible Study.......................... 7:30 p.m.
( Summer..............................8:00 p.m.)

EVANS CHAPEL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. G A . Blocker
Sunday School................ 10:00 am .
Morning Wwship............11:00 am.
Afternoon Worship.......... 2:00 p.m.
Training Union.........................6:00 p.m.
Evening W arship.............7:00 p.m.
Wednesday.

Prayer Meeting............ 7:00 p.m.

n R S T  ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD CHURCH 

Floydada
Vance Mitchell, Pastor

Sunday School........................9:45 am.
Morning Worship.......... 10:50 am.
Sunday Evening

Evangelistic.........................6:00 p.m.
Wednesday.

Night Service.............7:30 pjm.

n R S T  BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Howell E. Farnsworth Jr. 
Michael Holster, Musk/Ed. 

Sunday:
Sunday School.......... 9:45 am .
Morning Worship.. . .  11:00 am .

Interest Studies......... 5:30 p.m.
Discipleship Training.. .  6 p.m.
Youth Choir.................6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship. . . .  7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday:
Children's Choirs . . . .  4:00 p.m.

Evening M eal.............5:45 pjn.
R.A.'s & G .A .'a .............6:45 p.m.
Preschool Choir............ 6:45 p.m.
Prayer Meeting..............7:00 p.m.
Youth Bible Study..........7:00 p.m.
Adult Choir.............................7:45 p.m.

n R S T  BAPTIST CHURCH 
Lockney

Harold Abney, Pastor 
Les Reed, Youth Minister 

Kent Lloyd, Music Minister 
Sunday:
Sunday School........................... 9:45 am .
Morning Worship.......... 10:45 am .
Discipleship Training . . . .  6:00 pjn. 
Kids of The King

Children’s Choir............6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship............  7:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Prayer Meeting............. 7:00 p.m.
Y ou i Activities............. 7:00 p.m.
RA's and GA's........................ 7:00 p.m.
Pre-School Choir........... 7:00 p.m.
Adult Choir.............................8:00 p.m.

3rd Saturdays:
Men's Breakfast............ 7:00 a.m.

1st Tuesday and 3rd Mondays:
Bt^tist Women..............3:00 p.m.

n R S T  CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
Rev. Robin Hoover

Sunday School...................9:45 am .
Sunday Worship.............11:00 am .

**41*41
n R S T  UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Clark Williams, Pastor
Sunday School...................9:45 am .
Morning Worship............ 11:00 am .
Youth Fellowship..............5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship..............6:00 p.m.

*****
n R S T  UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
Lockney

Tommie Beck, Pastor
Sunday School...................9:15 am .
Worship Service............ 10:30 a.m.
UMY.................................. 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship...............6:00 p.m.
United Methodist Women, Hill
Circle, 3rd Tuesday___ 9:30 a.m.

Ruth Wesley Circle , 2nd and 4th
Mondays...................10:30 am .

*****
FRIENDSHIP CHAPEL CME 

Floydada
Rev. James Jenkins

Sunday..................................... 9:45 am .
Morning Service.............. 11:00 am .
Wednesday.

Bible Study................ 8:00 p.m.
*****

GRACE FELLOWSHIP 
CHURCH

211N. Main, Lockney 
Interdenominational Church 

Rev. Ted Samples, Pastor
Sunday School........................  9:45 am .
Morning Worship...........11:00 am .
Evening Worship............ 7:30 p.m.
Wednesday Service...........7:30 p.m.

GRANT CHAPEL 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST 
John WiUiams, Pastor

Sunday School.........................10:00 am .
Monday Worship.......... 11:00 am .
Evening Service........................ 7:30 p.m.
Tuesday:

Prayer Service.............. 8:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service........... 7:30 p.m.

*****

IGLESIA DEL REY JESUS 
404 E. 6th S t, Lockney 

Lupe Banda, Pastor
Sunday School.................. 10:00 am .
Evening Service............. 6:00 p.m.
Tuesday:

Youth Service...........................7:30 pjn.
*****

MAIN STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Lockney
Ed Hull, Minister

Bible Study..................................9:30 am .
Morning Worship..............10:30 ajn.
Evening Worship................6:00 p.m.
Wednesday.

Ladies Bible Class........ 9:30 am .
Bible Study............................7:30 p.m.

*****
MT. ZION 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Ralph Jackson
Sunday School...................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.............. 11:00 am .
BTU.............................................6:00 pjn.
Evening Worship........................7:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Mid-Week Prayer........... 7:00 pjn.
Thursday:

Bible Study............................7:00 p.m.
*****

NEW SALEM PRIMITIVE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Jim Jackson, Pastor

Sunday: Congregational
Singing.......................... 10:30 ajn.

Morning Worship.............. 11:00 a.m.
*****

PRIMER IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA 

Lockney
Johnny Silva, Pastor

Sunday School.................... 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service.............. 11:00 a.m.
Training Union....................5:00 p.m.
Evening Service.................. 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service.............7:30 pjn.
G.A.'s...................................7:30 p.m.
Ambassadors....................... 7:30 p.m.
Fellowship Luncheon - 

1st Sunday of Month 
Music Worship -

Last Sunday with evening service

PRIMERA MISION 
BAUTISTA 

Floydada 
Rev. Lupe Rando

Sunday School............................ 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.............. 10:55 ajn.
Evening Worship........................ 6:00 pjn.
Wednesday Evening........... 7:00 p.m.
1st Wed............. Organization Night

*****
SAN JOSE

CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Lockney

Msgr. Tim Scbwertner, Pastor
Wednesday:
Communion Service..........8:00 p.m.

Sunday M ass......................11:30 a.m.
*****

SOUTH PLAINS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ernest Stewart, Pastor
Sunday School.................. 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.............. 11:00 a.m.

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD TEMPLO 
GETSEMANI 
308 Mississippi 

Rev. Thomas G. Lopez
Sunday School...........................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship...............11:00 a.m.
Evening Evangelistic

Service.................................... 6:00 pjn.
Wednesday;

Family Night.......................... 7:30 p.m.
*****

ST. MARY MAGDALEN 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Floydada
Father Ricardo Salditos

Sunday Mass.................. 11:30a.m.
W eek ly  Masses............. 7:30p.m.

(Tuesiday, Thursday, Saturday) 
Office A Rectory Phone; 983-S878 

*****
TEMPLO BAUTISTA 

SALEM 
Lockney

Pedro Reyes, Interim Pastor
Sunday School...............9:45 a.m.
Wwship Service...........11:00 a.m.
Christian Training.............5:00 p.m.
Evening W orsh^.............. 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday:

Prayer Meeting.............7:30 p.m.

TEMPLO BETHEL 
SPANISH

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Washington and 1st St. 

Lockney 652-2181
Armando Finales, Pastor

Sunday School................. 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.......... 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship............... 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service...........7:30 p.m.

TEMPLO EVANGELICO 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

Natividad Luna, Pastor 
515 E. Missouri, Floydada

Sunday School...................9:45 a.m.
Evening W orship.............5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service..........7:00 p.m.

*****
TEMPLO NUEVA VIDA 

Rev. Herman Martinez 
308 W. Tennessee

Sunday School................ 10:00 a.m.
Sunday Prayer Service---- 2:00 p.m.
Evening Worship.............5:00 p.m.
Tuesday:

Evening Service.............7:30 p.m.
Thursday Service.............. 7:30 p.m.

*****
TEMPLO PODER DE LA 

ALABANZA PENTECOSTES 
Rev. Manuel Rendon, Pastor 

704 N. Main, Lockney 
652-3704

Sunday Services............  10:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening........................ 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday................................ 7:30 p.m.

TRINITY CHURCH 
500 W. Houston Floydada 
Interdenominational Church 

Glenn Wachob, Pastor
Sunday School...........................9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship............ 10:50 a.m.
Sunday Evening................ 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday: Prayer........... 7:30 p.m.

*****
TRINITY

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Providence Community 

The ReverendCharles C hapm an, 
Supply Pastor 

Sunday School &
Adult Bible Class____10:15 a.m.

Warship Service.......... 11:30 a.m.
*****

VICTORY BAPTIST CHURCH 
601W. Lee, Floydada 

983-5437
Gordon Parsley, Pastor 

Sunday School&Church Service.
Continuous........................  10:00 a.m.

Evening Service...................... 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday.

Prayer&Bible Study. . .  7:00 p.m. 
*****

WEST SIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Hoydada 983-3548

Sunday Worship.......................10:30 a.m.
Sunday Evening........................ 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday................................ 7:00 p.m.

*****

Worship at the 
Church of Your Choice

%



Page 6 - The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon - Thursday Septembers, 1994 

fo o tb a ll -
crou

n u  •  

>tbaU 
Lpoun-
J k e t -
^ g o l f

-football- football - basket- 
eolf

?> Whirlwinds edge Longhorns for county crown
■ I  ____  Finvdsfla.* • nrttch if thev exDCCt lo Hiakc it two in a

baUl 
fool 
cross'
-basketball 
try - 
baU- 
- base 
ball 
n i s - c r i  

baU 
coun! 
ketball - track 
golf - baseball 
ketball - 1 
golf - foo! 
nis- 
ball
country- 
ki

I golf

ball
t • tennis - cross coun- 

, -football • basket- 
• golf

3lf

___________  ball
track - tennis - cross coun- 

et- 
lolf 
et-

3SS country - 
ootball - bas- 
oss country - 
- track - ten- 

foot- 
- aoss 

bas-

all -

FHS
Coach's

Comments
FLOYDADA-According to Floy- 

dada coach Bryan Davis, were very
happy to get out of Lockney with a vic­
tory. They played us tough, but both 
teams made a lot of opening-night mis­
takes. We are all proud of the way our 
kids responded and went 54 yards in two 
plays to pull out the win at the end of 
the game."

The coach also said, are pretly 
young in a lot of places and grew up a 
lot last Friday. With the schedule we 
have coming up (Brownfield, Post and 
Childress), we'll have to grow up a lot 
more in the next three weeks."

Davis added, "We were real pleased 
with our defensive efifoit. It took a while 
to pick up their stunts. We worked on 
that in practice and looked better We'll 
see Brownfield stunting much the same 
way this week. Brownfield is better and 
much bigger physically than Lockney . 
. .  they are a large 3A school and have 
plenty of depth."

Defensive coordinator Rex 
Holcombe, discussing Brownfield's of­
fense. stated, "They'll give us a similar 
tandem look as Lockney. Well have to 
make adjustments for their returning 
quarterback -  he scrambled for about 
75 yards against us last year They have 
good size and speed and an experienced 
fullback."

Holcombe added, "We'll have our 
hands full."

Offensive coordinator Lee Hurt said, 
"They'll line up in a 4-3 and sometimes 
will have all 11 within 5 yards of the 
line of scrimmage. They have good size 
up IronL Their linebackers are quick and 
the middle linebacker is a quality foot­
ball player. We'll see a lot of man coveF 
age (on pass routes), and we'll see a lot 
of saifety blitzes. If we correct last week's 
m istakes, we should have a good 
chance."

All the coaches noted and expressed 
their appreciation for the fan support and 
the laige following at Lockney, and are 
looking forward to the home-opener 
against Brownfield.

It'stliattinie 
again, when ihe 

leaves fall and class calls!

By Bill Gray
FLOYDADA-Floydada scored the 

winning touchdown and two-point con­
version in the fuial two minutes to rally 
past Lockney 8-7 as the Whirlwinds re­
tained the Floyd County Championship 
on September 2. The exciting finish, 
before a packed house at Lockney's 
Mitchell-Zimmerman Field, was almost 
a carbon cq>y of last year's 14-13 come- 
from-behind Whirlwind victory at 
Wester Field.

For 3 1/2 quarters, neither team was 
able to generate a sustained scoring 
threat. A Floydada turnover, with 9:11 
remaining in the fmal period, opened the 
door for an apparent Longhorn winning 
drive. Lockney's Tanner Johnson hit 
freshman sensation Charles VanZandt 
with a 21-yard scoring suike on a fade 
pattern, Matthew Raissez kicked the 
extra point, and it appeared that 
Floydada's seven-year dominance in this 
long and storied rivalry was at an end.

Only 2:23 showed on the game clock. 
Time and again throughout the evening 
the Whirlwinds' offensive attack had 
been stymied by a swarming and blitz­
ing Longhorn defense. A 15-yard pen­
alty against Lockney on the ensuing 
kickoff gave the Whirlwinds excellent 
field position and one fmal opportunity 
to pull out the victory. And, the "Winds 
responded to the challenge.

Hoydada tailback Pete Cooper picked 
up nine yards to move the "AMnds into 
Lixkney territory at the 45 yard line. QB 
Sammy Rodriquez started the option to 
the left side on second down and pitched 
to Cooper. The all-district speedster 
twisted away from several would-be 
tacklers, broke another tackle in the sec­
ondary, and rambled into the north end 
zone. Rodriguez added the all-important 
two-pointer with a gutsy dive across the 
double stripe. Floydada's winning drive 
took only 28 seconds.

Both teams' defenses pretty well con­
trolled the flow of the first seven min­
utes of the initial period as each offense 
attempted to establish some early conti­
nuity. The early going could best be 
compared to a couple of heavyweight 
boxers testing one another or two world- 
class chess players attempting to get the 
better of each other.

The Longhorns picked up the tempo 
late in the first quarter when Carlos 
Perales recovered a Floydada fumble 
deep in Whirlwind territory. However, 
Lockney failed to capitalize on the 
break. They were penalized twice on the 
possession, and were forced to turn over 
the ball on downs at the Whirlwind 27. 
Rodriguez completed a 20-yard pass to 
Ken Cummings to move the "Wnds to

midfield as the fust stanza drew to a 
close.

Floydada staged its most serious 
threat to open the second quartet: High­
lighted by Pete Cooper's 20-yard run, the 
"Winds made their deepest penetration 
into Lockney territory. The 12-play, 49- 
yard drive stalled when Floydada failed 
to convert a fourth down attempt. 
Lockney's Michael Hernandez and 
freshman Josh Lambert conveiged on 
Sammy Rodriguez, holding the Whirl­
wind QB to zero yardage. The 'Homs 
took over on downs at their own 24 yard 
line with 7:19 remaining in the first half.

Defensive gems were turned in by

Zach Abshier, Chad Hinsley and 
Michael Mercado as Floydada held the 
Longhorns to minus yardage in the en­
suing series. Following an exchange of 
punts. Tanner Johnson guided the "Homs 
to an 8-play, 41-yard drive. A 15-yard 
Johnson mn off the option and a 24-yard 
pass to Shannon Veal helped move 
Lockney to the Floydada 37, but the 
halftime horn sounded before the Long­
horns could do anything to break the 0- 
0 deadlock.

Floydada picked up a first down on 
Pete Cooper's 12-yard carry in its first 
offensive series following intermission. 
However, Lockney's Lalo Chavira and 
Carlos Perales sacked Rodriguez for a 
4-yard loss - forcing Abshier's third punt 
of the evening (a booming 43-yarder 
which pinned the "Homs on their own S 
yard line). Freshman Devon Phillips' 
nifty 24-yard run helped Lockney out 
of the hole, but the "Homs couldn't sus­
tain a drive and Raissez punted back to 
the Winds.

Rodriguez was shaken up on the first 
play of Floydada's next series, and 
Abshier entered the game at quarterback 
for several plays. Sammy returned to 
action in time to execute a first down 
run, but the "Winds were stopped on 
Lockney's 43. Abshier's 39-yard punt 
again drove the Longhorns into a deep 
hole.

Lockney started the final period on its 
own 18 yard line -  minus its starting 
quarterback. Johnson was injured in the 
final moments of the third quarter and 
was replaced for a few plays by Veal. 
Johnson returned, following the key 
Floydada turnover, and directed an 11- 
play, 66-yard scoring drive. The drive 
started with a 15-yard pass to Phillips, 
consumed 5 1/2 minutes of time, and 
ended with the 21-yard touchdown toss 
to VanZandL With but 2:23 showing on
the clock, it appeared that the "Homs 
were on the way to their first win in this

y v

WHIRLWIND TAILBACK Pete Cooper is forced out-of-bounds by Lockney 
Longhorn Joe Marks as other defenders Devon Phillips (7) and Josh Lambert 
(60) rush to assist -  Staff Photo

Please Use  
CAUTION

in School Zones

w h irlw ind  gibca... 
by b ill gray

series since 1986.
The Longhorns' premature celebration 

ended 28 seconds latec Following the 
ensuing kickoff it took the Whirlwinds 
only two plays to cover the 54 yards to 
Lodoiey's end zone and the dramatic 2- 
point conversion by Rodriguez. During 
Floydada's post-game victory celebra­
tion, the Floydada quanerbacl^ who pro­
duced the game-winnei; commented, "I 
got hit solid at the two yard line, but 
the coaches teach us to keep our legs 
moving when we're h it It was a tough 
game . . .  Lockney played their hearts 
o u t . . .  but we played just a little bit 
better when it le ^ y  counted."

Lockney will regroup and travel to 
Petersburg this Friday. The Buffaloes
scored twice in the fourth quarter to up­
end Crosby ton 27-14 last week. The 
Brownfield Cubs will help the Whirl­
winds open their home schedule with a 
8:00 p.m. kickoff at Wester Field.

The Cubs, still seething from their 12- 
7 loss to the Whirlwinds at Brownfield 
a year ago, will be looking for their first 
win of the season. If it weren't bad 
enough that the Cubs hope to atone for 
last year's close loss to the Whirlwinds, 
Brownfield will want to show that last 
week's 16-8 loss to highly-regarded 
Littlefield wasn't a fluke.

The post-Shad Evans era sees 
Brownfield as a more balanced club. 
QB-FS Rhett Graham (6-1,180) passed 
for 188 yards with seven completions 
in 16 attempts and had one interception 
in the loss to Littlefield. Graham passed 
for over 900 yards a year ago in a run- 
orientated offense. Fleet receiver Johnny 
Quesada (S-7, 127) averaged over 20 
yards-per-ieception a year ago. (^esada 
stung Littlefield for 85 yards on three 
catches last week.

Brownfield will again have a strong 
ground game. The Cubs rushed for 123 
yards against the vaunted Littlefield de­
fense, led by James Panda's 66 yards on 
eight carries and Kevin Flournoy's 40 
yards on 13 attempts. Rusty Pickett, cen­
ter (5-8, 204), Jabe Riley, tackle (6-5, 
210), Adam Furlow, guard, and tight end 
Mickey McCalib (5-11,205) help form 
the nucleus of a productive "I" forma­
tion attack.

If the Cubs have any weakness it 
could be their 4-3 defense, where they 
return only three starters from the dis­
trict cham pionship team. Graham 
doubles at free safety and Russell 
Perkins returns to his comerback slot 
Linebacker James Pauda (5-9, 165) is 
the only returnee in the front seven of 
Coach Eddie Hooper's stopper unit. 
Based on the "classics" the past couple 
of years, the 1994Whirlwind-Cub clash 
promises more of the same.

BILL'S NOTES
Talk about deja vul It was lame aong, aec- 

ond verse. For the second year in a row 
Lockney played an inspired 44 minutes . . .  
only to have a victory slip away at game's 
end. Although the Whirlwinds tnade a num­
ber of mental mistakes and committed a 
couple of costly turnovers, a lot of credit has 
to go to the scrappy Longhorns.

Coach Malcolm Moerbe's game plan kept 
Floydada guessing for the better part of the 
evening. His defensive front gave the young 
Whirlwind line about all it could handle, and 
the blitzing/stunting linebackers wrecked 
havoc with Floydada's option until the final 
moments.

I can't say enough about the performances 
of the three freshmen who played such im­
portant roles for the 'Homs on both sides of 
the ball. Josh Lambert had a whale of a game 
at linebacker, and Charles VanZandt had a 
great defensive game for his first of many 
starts. But, it was on offense that VanZandt 
and Devon PhiUips really shined.

A year ago Charles was playing in the 
"Pop Warner"-type junior leagues at F t  
Benning, Georgia, (his father is a recently- 
retired Army staff sergeant). Not only d o u  
he have natural football talent, but he also 
had lo have some excellent coaching in the 
basics of the game. I complained to his 
mother, Vanessa (manager at Allsup's in 
Floydada), "When you folks dedded to move 
to Texas, 1 wish you had chosen to live in

PUT THIS AD UNDER A MAGNET 
ON YOUR REFRIGERATOR!

To remind you of a great way to earn money.
It's through Farmers IRA's and TAX SHELTERED ANNUITIES.
Our current interest rate is 6.25% compounded annually.
(Higher Rates available for deposits over $50,000).

If you already have an IRA or CD now renewing, or if you want 
to start an IRA or TAX SHELTERED ANNUITY... I'm ready 
to help you. You'll love the interest Farmers has in you.

FARM ERS INSURANCE G R O U P O F  Companies

Philip Wilbanks
806-983-2881 111 B. East Missouri. Floydada. Texas 79235

A Horseless |
RODEO

Floyd County Fair
Saturday, September 17

* * *

Books Open 3:00 p.m.
Rodeo Starts at 4:0b p.m.

* * *

Events for All Ages - 4 to 17 years

stick Horse Race - Boot Race - Ribbon Race - 
Goat Tying and Dressing - Calf & Steer Ropingj

* * *

$2.00 per entry - 50% Jackpot Plus Ribbons & Awards |
* * *

Sponsored by the Silver Spurs 4-H Horse Pro|ect |  
Call 652-3135 for Information
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Floydada."
QB Tanner Johnson had an outstatvling 

outing, as did the rest of the Longhorns. 
Good luck, 'Homs. You certainly made the 
Harris System look bad, as usual (they had 
the 'Winds listed as 18-point favorites). 
Lockney is certainly going to make some 
waves this year in District 3-2A. One thing 
for sure. . .  the "Homs aren't any cellar team 
in that districti

Congratulations to Coach Bryan Davis on 
his first win as Floydada's head mentor. Af­
ter the game Davis stated, "111 tell you what 
. . .  I wasn't so sure about getting that fust 
victory when we were trailing with a little 
over two minutes to go. But, you've got to 
give our kids a lot of credit for keeping their 
heads up and taking two plays to go about 
60 yard^ or whatever it was."

ll ie  coach added, "Fm awfully proud of 
the kids. They're young and we made a lot 
of mistakes. Actually, we shouldn't have been 
in that situation. . .  we were down there and 
had chances to score several times and made 
some mistakes. But, you know what matters 
is that final score."

When Davis was questioned about the 
decision lo go for the two-pointer, the coach 
replied, "When we scored, there was no hesi­
tation in going for the win. We called time 
out to insure that we would be very certain 
as to what play to run." Davis said, "It was a 
great playf Sammy's a winner and hell find 
some way to get the job done if possible. 
That's why we went with that (option) play.'

The two-point conversion gets my nod as 
the offeruive play of the game. Not only 
because it decided the final outcome, but the 
way Sanuny executed i t . . .  after being hit, 
he kept churning and, as he went down, he 
extended the ball over his head to break the 
plane of the goal line.

Pete Cooper gets my vote for offcasive 
player of the game. His 45-yarder put the 
'Winds in position for the victory and his 127 
yards on 18 carries led all rushers.

The defensive play of the game goes to 
Lockney's recovery of Floydada's second 
fumble. . .  which led to the Longhorn's go- 
ahead touchdown. My defensive player of 
the game goes to junior Zach Abshier. Not 
only did he make several key plays from his 
defensive end post, he also kept the 'Horns 
pinned deep in their own territory with a 
couple of booming punts. Any questions 
about the effectiveness of Floydada's kick­
ing and punting chores were answered.

My "Headhunter" award goes to Sammy 
for his "stick" on Charles V an2^dt on the 
next-to-last play of the third quarter . . .  it 
was a good, clean h it In fact, it was a good, 
clean game in spite of the intense rivalry 
between the two squads. THAT is a credit to 
both coaching staffs and both teams.

Lockney will give Coach Moerbe his first 
win this week with a 20-14 verdict at Pe­
tersburg. The Whirlwinds need to turn it up

a notch if they expect 
row over the Cubs. The pollsters wiU say "no 
way," but ril have to go with the Whirlwinds 
by three points in another Wester Field 
thriller. Bill's other pics:

Littlefield 22, Tulia 7 
Dimmin 20, Sanford-Fritch 13 
Denver City 31, Muleshoe 20 
Shallowater 19, Lubbock Cooper 7 
Friona 27, Portales, N.M. 12 
Texas A&M 31, Oklahoma 27 
(Kyle Field jinx gigs the Sooners)
Upset Special: Post 23, Slaton 21

SCORE BY QUARTERS 
Floydada 0 0 0 8 — 8
Lockney 0 0 0 7 — 7
LHS: Charles VanZandt21 pass from Tan­

ner Johnson (M. Raissez kick), 2:23 
FHS: Pete C ooper 45 run (Sammy 

Rodriguez run), 1:55
INDIVIDUAL STATISTICS 
RUSHING: FHS -  Pete Cooper 21-122,

1TD; Frankie Luna 4-27; Zach Abshier 2-(- 
2): Ranee Barnett 2-(-3); Vernon Cooper 1- 
4; Terry Harris 1-2; Sammy Rodriguez 10- 
(-9); LHS -  Tanner Johnson 17-86; Devon 
Phillips 7-42; Joe Marks 3-9; Charles 
Vanzandt 8-6.

PASSING: FHS -  Sammy Rodriguez 3- 
5-0,27 yds. LHS -  Tanner Johnson 3-12-0, 
60 yds., 1 TD; Shannon Veal 0-2-1.

RECEIVING: FHS -  Ken Cummings 1- 
20; Vernon Cooper 1-7; Pete Cooper 1-0. 
LHS -  Shannon Veal 1-24; Charlci 
VanZandt 1-21,1 TD; Devon Phillips 1-15.

FUMBLE RECO VERIES: LHS -  Carlos 
Perales, Michael Hernandez.

PASS INTERCEPTIONS: FHS -  Vernon 
Cooper.

RETURN YARDS: FHS -  Ranee Barnett 
2-20 (kickoffr), Vernon Cooper 1-10 (punt). 
LHS -  Charles VanZandt 1-22 (kickofO: 
Tbrmer Johnson 1-13 (punt); Joe Marks 1-7 
(kickofO; Michael Henumidez 1-7 (fumble 
recovery).

TACKLES/ASSISTS (over 5): FHS ~  
Peter Luna 10/2; Anthony Emert 9/2; Zach 
Abshier 6/3; Angel Aleman 5/2. LHS — Joe 
Marks 11/2; Matthew Raissez 9/3; Lalo 
Chavira 7/2; Mikhael Durham 5/2.

TEAM STATISTICS
Floydada Lockney
2 Penetrations 1
3 of 7 3rd Down Conversions 2 o f l0
lo f 2 4th Down Conversions lo f  1
10 1st Downs 9
41-141 Rushes-Yards 35-143
27 Passing Yards 60
168 Total Yards 203
3-5-0 Comp-Att-Inl 3-14-1
4-30 Penal ties-Yards 7-65
2-2 Fumbles-Lost 2-0
4-39.0 Punts-Average 5-30.6
30 Return Yards 49
23:14 Time of Possession 24:46

.........................................................................A

^Payne <^^m> (P/iarmacy
''Working hard to he your hometown pharmacy"
^--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- ^

Drop by to see o u t . .

Sterling Silver "Whirlwind” Jewelry
s ________________________________________________________________ y

-  -  Beat Brownfield  -  -

200S. Main, Flo^^dada 983-5111

WITHANEWDQL
LEMON FREEZE.*

It's the newest 

frozen treat from 

Dairy Queen*! The 

DQ* Lemon Freez'r 

It’s tangy. Refreshing 

Smooth. And delicious!

And it's also non-fat and 

cholesterol free You've just 

gotta try it! Only at your par­

ticipating Dairy Queen* stores!

®Reg. U.S. Pal. & Tm. 0f1 Am. D Q Corp



Pep Rally planned at 
R.C. Andrews Friday

FLOYDADA—This week's pep 
rally to get Floydada fans in the 
spirit for the Floydada Whirlwind 
versus Brownfield Cubs game will 
be at R.C. Andrews Elementary, 
begmning at 12:05 p.ra. Everyone 
is invited to attend and cheer on the 
team.

'Winds take Longhorns again
Tkunday, Septembers, 1994 - The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacom - Paee 7

By the Lockney Athletic 
Booster Club Reporter 
There is an old sayiog *Xnose only 

counts in horseshoes and hand gre­
nades” but that’s not necessarily true. It 
counts in Lockney. Lockney is very 
proud of this young Longhorn football 
team. They gave Floydada all they 
wanted and then some.

Even though we came up a little short

Hale earns first place check for 
week one of football contest

The first tie-breaker game was util­
ized to determine the winner o£ the first 
prize for the initial week of the annual 
Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon Foot­
ball Contest Jean Hale of Floydada and 
Phillip Glasson of Lockney each missed 
three games on the contest Hale se­
lected Floydada to win in the tie­
breaker, thus nudging Glasson out He 
chose Lockney as the winner. Hale will 
be able to pick up her first place check 
for $25.00 at the Floydada ofilce on 
Friday, September 9.

The second place check for $15.00 
will be available for Glasson in the 
Lockney Office on Friday.

The third place check for $10.00 will 
be waiting in the Roydada office on 
Friday for Mike Anderson who missed 
four games on the contest this week.

Honorable mention goes to those 
missing five games this week, W. H. 
Simpson of Roydada and Boyd Lee of 
Lockney. Bob Alldredge, Sheree Can­
non, Sam Hale, A. W. James, Sammy 
Bradley, and Stan Payne, all of 
Roydada, as well as Coby Marr and 
Roger Perez of Lockney, each missed 
six games this week. Five entries 
missed seven games on the contest this 
week eleven entries missed eight

There were a total of 25 entries in the 
Lockney contest box including one 
which was left in the drop box after 5:00 
p.m. on Friday and was not counted for 
the contest. There were 54 entries in the 
Roydada contest box, making a total of 
79 entries for the contest this first week.

CONTEST RULES
Anyone above the age of seven is 

eligible to submit an entry except em­
ployees of this newspaper and their 
immediate families living in the same 
household.

No mail entries will be accepted. All 
entries must be submitted on the official 
entry form printed on the Football Con­
test page of each weekly issue. All en­
tries must be taken to the Hesperian- 
Beacon Office, either at 102 W. Bryant 
in Lockney or 111 E. Missouri in 
Roydada. Each entry must be in the 
office no later than 5:00 p.m. on Friday 
of each week.

The contest is simple to enter. Clip 
out the entry form coupon on the contest

page and circle the number correspond­
ing to the team you think wiU win in each 
of the games listed in the footballs on the 
contest page. If you think two teams will 
tie, circle both numbers. Select a winner 
in each of the two tie-breaker sames on 
the contest entry coupon and write your 
guess of the total combined points of the 
two teams in the accompanying foot- 
balL If a tie occurs in which a winner 
caimot be determined by using the two 
tie-breaker games, the prize will be 
shared by those tying.

Readers are reminded that entries are 
limited to one entry per week per person. 
Weekly winners are limited to one per 
household per week.

The contest entries will be graded 
each Monday following the weekend 
games. Results will be announced in the 
next issue of this newsptq)er and checks 
for prize money may be picked up at the 
aniropriate Hesperian-Beacon Ofilce, 
either in Floyda^ or Lockney, on Fri­
day.

SPONSORS
Shopping with the businesses that 

sponsor the contest will let them know 
you i^preciate their sponsorship of the 
local football contest Among those 
businesses kind enough to help The 
Hesperian-Beacon bring the contest to 
you this season are: Cargill Hybrid 
Seeds, AgEquipment Group, L.P., 
Schacht's Rowers, Jewelry & Gifts, 
Wilson Photogr^hy, The First National 
Bank in Lockney & the Floydada 
Branch, R Photography, Roydada Coop 
Gin, City Auto, Payne Family Phar- 
nuicy. Lighthouse Electric Company, 
The Rrst National Bank of Roydad^ 
Brown Implement, Royd County Farm 
Bureau, Script Printing and Office S up- 
ply, Higginbotham-Bartlett Lumber 
Company, Tipton Oil & Butane, Cor­
nelius Conoco, Hale Insurance & Real 
Estate, Producer’s Coop Elevator, 
Muncy Elevator, Our Place Drive-In, 
Ray L<% Equipment Company, Lowe’s 
Pay-n-Save in Roydada, Lowe’s Pay-n- 
Save in Lockney, Roydada Power &. 
Light, Lockney Meat Company, Provi­
dence Farm Supply & Grain, Kellison 
Fertilizer & Spraying, Don Hardy Fuel 
Efficient Engine Service, Lambert 
Spraying, Caprock Meat Company and 
die Royd County Hesperian-Beacon.

(8-7) on the scoreboard, this team and signs of coming together. The line is 
their coaches have nothing to be beginning to knock people around: The 
ashamed of. When you give all you have ends are catching the ball a lot better 
for 48 minutes, you can’t ask any more The backs are running and blocking 
from a team. much better.

“Gremgame guys!" With 9:11 left in the game, the offense
Tiis is a very young team. Many of took control Friday night, mixing the 

the young men got their first taste of pass and run and marched down the field 
varsity football last Friday night (in- to score. I see many good things ahead 
eluding three freshmen that started), this season for this offense.
There were a lot ofquestionmarits going The defense played an outstanding 
into Friday nights game, but I think they game. They put pressure on Roydada’s 
were all answered. With a young and quarterback all night long. Rodriquez 
inexperienced team these kids are going had trouble running and throwing the 
to make ^ m e  mistakes. football because he had ‘Homs in his

Penalties hurt the ‘Homs Friday faceatevery play. Except for a couple of 
night This is to be expected. If the runs^ they shut down Roydada’s run- 
coaches can help the ‘Homs correct ning game also. If this defense can stay 
their miscues there is no telling how far g^vay from injuries they are going to get 
they can go ^ is  sea^n. This team has stronger and tougher, 
the c^abiliiies of winning a lot of ball The ‘Homs travel to Petersburg this 
games. to take on a tough Buffalo squad.

The offense is really starting to show They have a lot of kids coming back
from last year and this will be another 

T T \ /  -fan  O game. But I am sure the ‘Homs
J— J V i  d l l  ̂  will meet the challenge-Good Luck!

to Whirlwind JV 
in season opener

By the JV Coaches
The Lockney junior varsity footall 

team travled to Roydada Thursday to 
play their first game of the season.

The Longhorns started out slow with 
the Whirlwinds taking a 28 point lead in 
the first half.

This did not dampen the Longhorns 
spirits as they came back to hold 
Roydada to six points in the second half, 
while scoring 18.

J.R. Walker scored first with a 30 yard 
run. The two-point conversion failed.

The next score was a 20 yard touch­
down pass from Carson Johnson to Max 
Ramirez.

Tl:e Whirlwinds scored again, but 
J.R. Walker ran the kickoff back 70 
yards for a touchdown.

The final score was 34-18.
The young men did a great job in the 

second half. The defense was led by 
Anthony Poole, Richard Guerrero and 
Eric Bartlett.

The Longhorns next game will be at 
home Thursday against Petersburg.

Wester Field gates 
,̂open at 6:30 p.m.

LOCKNEY FRESHMAN RUNNING BACK Devon PhiUips is pursued by 
Whirlwind defender Angel Aleman in game action last Friday at Mitchell- 
Zimmerman Field. ■■ Staff Photo

Whirlwind JV upends Lockney JV

FLOYDADA—Roydada Independent 
School D istrict reminds Floydada 
Whirlwind fans that all the gates at 
Wester Field will be open an hour and a 
half before the game starts.

For the first three home games that 
time will be 6:30 p.m., with the games 
beginning at 8:00 p.m., and for the last 
two district games the gates will open 
at 6:(X) p.m., with the game starting at 
7:30 p.m.

By Bill Gray
FLOYDADA-Robert Cuba returned 

the opening kickoff 75 yards for a touch­
down to propel the Whirlwind JWrs to 
a 34-18 victory over Lockney's JV in the 
season-opener for both squads.The con­
version run failed, but it mattered little 
as Roydada scoed four times in the first 
half of the home-opener at Wester Reid 
on September 1.

Frankie Maldonado scampered in

LHS C o a c h ' s  
C o m m e n t s
By Malcom Moerbe
‘‘It was a tremendous pleasure watch­

ing our kids play as hard as they did and 
at the same time a tremendous disap­
pointment to not win the game. Every­
body gave tremendous effort They left 
nothing out on that field.

Our challenge this week is to bounce 
back and give that same kind of effort 
against a good Petersburg team. I have 
every reason to believe we will.”

Outstanding offensive performances 
were turned in by Tanner Johnson, 
Charles Van Zant, Devon Phillips, 
Shannon Veal and Mikhael Durham.

Defensive Point Leaders for this week 
are: Michael Hernandez - 38 

Josh Lambert • 28 
Carlos Perales - 28 
Matthew Raissez - 27 
Lalo Chavira - 24

from 10 yards o u t and Mario Nunez 
added a 4-yard TD to contribute to 
Roydada's scoring avalanche. Adam 
Per^ez converted on a run to extend 
Roydada's lead to 20-0 in the second 
period.

Runs of 16 and 11 yards by Robert 
Campbell as the outstanding defensive 
player. Chad Guthrie was also cited for 
his defensive efforts.

The squads will split this week as they 
travel to Brownfield. The 9th graders 
will play at 5:30 p.m., with the JV game 
scheduled at approximately 7:00 p.m. 
Cuba, and Omar Eguia's 22-yard run off 
a reverse, set up Roydada's fourth touch­

down by Eguia in the final moments of 
the stanza. Monty Anderson tossed a 
two-point conversion pass to Cuba, giv­
ing the Jr. Winds a 28-0 halftime ad­
vantage.

Roydada's 9 th graders combined with 
the junior varsity for the first game, and 
the freshmen played the majority of the 
second half. Locimey scored th r^  times 
following intermission, but freshmen 
Jason Campbell rushed in from six yards 
out for the final maigin of victory.

Cuba was named the offensive player 
of the game by the coaches. Eguia and 
Adam Perales also had outstanding of­
fensive outings. The coaches tabbed

Remember Grandparent’s Day 
September 11

SUPPORT the LHS JUNIOR CLASS 
Place your order early for. Football Mum 
Corsages, Garters or Boutonnieres with  

tnemhers of the junior class or here in the shop.

SCHACHT
Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts

FLOWM*•T mill

112 W. Poplar 652-2385 
8:30 - 5:30 Mon. - SaL 

"OUR PLEASURE IS TO SERVE YOU’

LITTLE CHEERLEADERS LEAD Y ELLS- Little 
cheerleaders, who participated in the summer cheer­
leader camp, help to lead the cheers at the pep rally held

Friday afternoon before the Lockney-Floydada football 
game. They also helped the varsity cheerleaders lead yells 
during the game. Staff Photo

Floydada 
Lions Club

2nd ANNUAL 
FISH FRY SUPPER
Friday, Sept. 9 - 5:30 - 8:00 p.m.

Before Brownfield Football Game 
Junior High Cafeteria

Adults - $5.00 
Children Under 12 - $3.50

If you’re really concerned 
about your health, mve your safety 

belt a workout.lt’s the best 
exercise we know-to keep you 

and your medical costs-  
from going through the roof.

yniCOUUlUMUlOTRIIIIUDUNNr.'
NaanouisiimTni

REMEMBER WHEN A  
HANDSHAKE WAS GOOD 

ENOUGH? WE DO.
NoLonĝ eimContiaas. No Hassles. No Problem.
If the only thing holding you back 
from experiencing the conven­
ience of cellular phone ser­
vice is the fact that you have 
to sign a long-term contract, then 
Digital Cellular is for you! Just tell 
us what type of service you want, and 
we'll get you started! No long-term

contract is required. You can take 
advantage of Digital Cellular's 

many features and services 
just as long as you want, and 

not as long as we want, like 
other cellular companies. And what 

a line-up of great, convenient services! 
Just take a look!

tMm§l

T O L L - F R E E  C A L L I N G
With Digital Cellular, you can call any­
where in Texas, New Mexico or Okla­

homa from Digital Cellu­
lar's home service area 
without paying any long 
distance charges! You 

pay only the regular airtime 
rates applicable! So whether you are on 
a tractor near Tahoka or in a car close to 
Cone, Digital Cellular puts you on the 
line to family, friends or business assoc­
iates in all three states for just pennies 
a minute! Toll-free calling is available 
to all callers, including non-Digital Cel­
lular customers.

O P T I O N 2  RATE P L A N
If you use your cellular phone regularly 
then OptionZ could be just the thing 
for you! With Option2, after you have 
talked just 120 minutes from your home 
system in a given month,every home 
minute for the entire month, 
fromthe first minute to 
the last, is charged to 
you at only 254! That's 
big savings to you if you 
use your cellular phone as 
little as 2 hours a month 
You also get all of Digital 
Cellular's free services, like 
6-Second Billing (one minute minimum 
on completed calls), Deatiled Billing, 
Call Forwarding and Call Waiting, 
3-Way Calling, and

3-Way Calling, and Incoming and Out­
going Call Restriction. Plus, OptionZ 
customers get Voice Mail free! Some 
other cellular phone companies charge 
for services like these, but they're FREE 
from Digital Cellular. Also free to 
Option 1 customers are 6-Second Billing, 
Call Forwarding and Call Waiting, and 
3-Way Calling!

E X T E N D E D  C O V E R A G E
We've extended our call delivery area 
to include most of the 
South Plains and part 
of West Texas, You 
can receive calls 
throughout the en­
tire Digital Cellular 
Coverage Area, without having to acti­
vate or pay for any special roaming 
services, while traveling in the exten­
ded coverage area.

IN FLOYDADA, CALL:. Oden Chevrolet (Mds 221 S. Main * 806/983-3789 
• City Auto, tnc. 201 E. Missouri * 806/983-3767

D igital CeHu k i
F T E X A S

W e^re  p u tt in g  y o u  o n  th e  lin e .
Box 53118 • Lubbock, Texas 79453

• »0b-‘)24-"4{2



Page 8 - The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon • Thursday September 8,1994
LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA - LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA - LOCKNEY - FLOYD ADA - LOC3CNEY -FLOYDADA

i through the h a u s
LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA - LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA - LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA - LOCKNEY - FLOYDADA

FLOYDADA JV 'WINDS -  The members of the 1994 
Junior Varsity Whirlwind Team include: (back row, left 
to right) Robert Cuba, Emilio Guzman, Jimmy Garcia, 
Chad Harmon, Chris Enriquez, Lupe Sanchez; (center 
row, left to right) Coach David Carr, Julian Hernandez,

Omar Eguia, Chad Guthrie, Victor Del Toro, Chad 
Hinkle, Eric Luna, Chad Benjamin, Joe Sanchez, Randy 
York, Coach Rex Holcombe; (front row, left to right) 
Coach Craig Cooke, Frankie Maldonado, Monty Ander­
son, and Coach Lee Hurt. — Photo by R Photography

%

FRESHMAN TEAM -  The Floydada High School Fresh­
man Football Team for the 1994 season include: (front 
row, left to right) Michael Palacios, Jason Campbell; (2nd 
row, left to right) Coach Craig Cooke, Pedro Chairez, 
Adam Perales, Richard Casillas, Dusty Jahay, and Coach 
Rex Holcombe; (3rd row, left to right) Justin Payne, Tim

Simpson, George Perez, Nick Williams; (4th row, left to 
right) Coach David C arr, Jason Henderson, Bobby 
Green, Blake Bramlett, Daniel Arellano, Jacob Thrasher; 
Coach Lee Hurt; (back row, left to right) Mario Nunez, 
Joe Ortiz, Tyson Whittle, Kyle Pierce, Warren Bishop, 
and Coy Holmes. Photo by R Photography

School Lunch and Breakfast Menus
FLOYDADA SCHOOL MENU

SepL 12-16
Monday:
Breakfast — Orange juice, cheese 

toast, milk
Lunch -  Chicken fried steak, gravj; 

mashed potatoes, green beans, peaches, 
hot roll, milk

Tuesday:
Breakfast — Apple juice, hot rice ce­

real, toast, milk
Lunch -  Com dogs, French fries, gin­

gerbread, applesauce, milk
Wednesday:
Breakfast — Pineapple juice, pan­

cakes, sausage on stick, milk
Lunch — Hamburger pizza, corn, 

pickle spears, pineapple, milk
Thursday:

Breakfast -  Grape juice, dry cereal, 
graham crackers, milk 

Lunch — Beef tacos, pinto beans, 
tossed salad, jcllo w/fruit, combread, 
milk 

Friday:
Breakfast -  Orange juice, pancakes, 

syrup, milk
Lunch -- Chili cheese sandwich, 

French fries, tossed salad, banana, milk

LOCKNEY SCHOOL MENU

September 12-16 
Monday:
Breakfast -  Cereal, toast, pineapple 

juice, milk
Lunch -  Pizza, lettuce and tomatoes, 

orange, cookie, milk

Tuesday:
Breakfast — Pancakes, ham, 

applesauce, milk
Lunch -  Burritoes, buttered com, roll, 

banana, milk
Wednesday:
Breakfast -  Cereal, cheese, milk, or­

ange and pineapple juice
Lunch -  Ham and cheese sandwich, 

pinto beans, cabbage slaw, cherry cob­
bler, milk

Thursday:
Breakfast -  French toast sticks, sau­

sage, apple, milk
Lunch — Chicken, gravy, roll, 

creamed potatoes, spinach, grapes, milk
Friday:
Breakfast -  Tortilla and egg, milk
Lunch — Fish, macaroni and cheese, 

green beans, roll, apple, milk

B iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiim iim iiH iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiH iiiiiiiiiiB
"Why Farm Bureau 

property insurance?"
“Protection. No doubt about it. 
We can help you plan just the 
coverage you need. With a 
broad selection of Homeowner 
Insurance Plans, as well as Fire 
and Dwelling Policies, there’s 
no wonder Americans from 
every walk of life depend on 
Farm Bureau Insurance.”

m

■,-r̂  ■ i

BAND PERFORMS AT HALFTIME -- The Lockney 
Longhorn Marching Band performed during halftime

break at the September 2 Lockney-Floydada football 
game. ** Staff Photo

% n
1SJ
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PREPARING FOR A SHOW DOW N-This was the scene Cheerleaders, band members, students and fans helped 
at the Friday afterncon all-school pep rally in Floydada. urge the 'Winds to victory. -  Staff Photo

Political C alendar
General Election 

Tuesday, November 8,1994

State Senator. District 30
Democrat

Steve Carriker
O uriker Cimpnign Fund 

P. O. Boa 517. Roby.Ta. 79543-0517

Republican
Tom Haywood

Tom (lay wood Campaign,
P. O. Boa S552, W id iiu  FalU, Ta. 76307-8552

Commissioner, Pet. 2
Democrat

Floyd Jackson
Campaipt Tieasuier: RoydJackion 
Boa 306, t.ockicy.Ta.792Al-0306

Republican
Leonard Gilroy

Camf>aign Treasurer: Leonard Gilroy 
R  O. Boa 535.Locki*y.Ta. 79241-0535

Need A Gift Idea?
How about a subscription to 

The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon 
Annual Rates:

Floyd, Crosby, Hale, Motley, Briscoe & Swisher Counties: S16.(X) 
Other Texas Counties: SI8.00 

Out of State: $19.00

Come by 111 E. Missouri, Floydada 
or 102 W. Bryant, Lockney

^  Paid Political Advertising ^

NOTWEARINGA
SAFETYBELTCANCOSr
YOUANARM&ALEG.

H
Kenneth Holt 

652-3456

Crosbyton Clinic Hospitai
Home Health

Where We Stili Beiieve In Making House Caiis

' *Tfiere 's a  fiousc  
zvfiose^ room s  

I  f^nozif Sy fieart.

^ f ie r e  I  te n d e d  tfie g a r d e n  
a n d  r e a d  m y  Sool^ .

W d e re  d rea m s w ere  d re a m t  
a n d  m em ories m ade.

W d e re  cftiC drengrezo u p  
a n d  I g r e z p  o(d.

‘There's a  dou se  
zvhere fife w a s  liv e d .

JA. dou se
w h ere  I  Sefong. ‘

Author Unknown

CLAR SCHACHT 
OfTice Manager

Helping You Is What We Do Best. =
FARM BUREAU INSURANCE|
LOCKNEY - 65?-2242 FLOYDADA - 983-3777 =

C a n d y  Thrasher SOUTH WALL, FLOYDADA, TEXAS 79235=

lllllllllllllllllllllllmlllllllllllllllllllllllM■■>■■■■■■■l>l<»■llllllll>»■»■lllMllllll■Nlllmli

It’s against the law. So if 
you don’t want a ticket, buckle up. 

Or, you could become broke 
in more ways than one.

youcouldlearnalotfronadunny;
BUCKLE YOUR SAFETY BELl

••NEIGHBORS HELPING NEIGHBORS’

675-2352 
1 - 800- 224-2352
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THE CIASSIFIEDS
Floydada

HOUSEIS FOR RENT ~~2>nd3 bodroom. 
Suiting at $330.00 per month. Call Laura at 
983-3761. I

tfc

BABY SITTER NEEDED —  Monday • 
Friday, Age 4.983-2022 (night).

9-8p

GARAGE SALES

Floydada
GARAGE SALE —  908 W. Georgia, Sat­
urday, 8:00 - ??

9-8p

WANTED —  Live-in help for elderly Sil- 
verton lady. Ambulatory but veiy helpless. 
Cooking and cleaning necessary. Would 
consider couple or single middle aged or 
older persons. Salary plus room and board. 
References required. Call 983-3570.

9-8p

LAKE PROPERTY FOR SALE

LAKE FRONT CABIN at Lake Homer. 
Red caboose with added living qpace., re­
frigerated air, himished, storage shed, dock, 
boat with outboard motor., nice beach and 
swimming area for kids. Very peaceful. 
$15,000.00. Call 652-2552 after 7:00 p jn .

tfhc

O ther
TWO FAMILY YARD SALE —  Satur­
day, 8:00 - 7 Kids and adults clothes, baby 
stuff and lots of good junk. 2 miles north of 
South Plains on Silverton Highway.

9-8p

LAYOUT-W ELDER —  Metric prinu. 
Positive attitude. Small company in Lub­
bock. 800-822-0777.

9-8p

E S TA TE  S A LE  
M E LV IN  BR O C K

I tirnitiiiT. :ip|)li:iiu't‘s. kiuiu-n 
tyitlftfls. linens, kniik kinicks. 

;uul null'll inure.
5 miles nurlh. 1 2 nest of l.oiknei 

on MW  ̂ MH. Red hriek lioiise. 
.S;ilui'(la\. .Septeinlier 10. S:00 ii.in.

HOUSES FOR SALE

Floydada
FOR SALE OR TRADE —  3 bedroom, 1 
bath. 803 W. Mariveiuu Would consider lake 
fnoperty. Call Paul Westbrook, 903-856- 
5906 or 903-856-3845.

tfc

3 BEDROOM, 2 BATH brick home, car­
port, storage building. 983-2239. 629 W. 
Jackson.

tfc

CRH
SYSTEMS
116 W. California
983-2445 983-3151

'For All Your Computer Needs' 
Visit Our Showroom 
Everyday Low Prices

N IC E T W O  AND T H R E E  bedroom 
homes in all areas of town. Several new ones 
just listed. For all your Real Estate needs, call 
Sam Hale Real Estate at 983-3261.

tfc

3 BEDROOM, 2 bath, 1 car garage. Central 
heat and air and ceiling fans. 504 S. White. 
Call 983-2718, after 6 p.m.

tfc

CLASSIFIED READERS ^ 
BEWARE

You are urged to use caution in re­
sponding to classiHcd advertising of­
fering jobs, merchandise, or services 
with unreasonable claims. Extra cau­
tion is especially important when ads 
require you to send money in order to 
receive information.
For more information and assistance 

regarding the investigation of get- 
rich-quick, work-at-home, and other 
flnanciaVbusiness opportunities. The 
Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon 
urges readers to contact:

The Better Business Bureau 
120614th St. Suite #901 

Lubbock, Tx. 79401 
or call 1-806-763-0459.

REAL ESTATE ADVERTISING
All real estate advertised in this 

newspaper is subject to the Federal 
Fair Housing Act of 1968 making it 
illegal to advertise "Any preference, 
limitation, or discrimination based on 
race color, religion, or national ori 
gin, or an intention to make any such 
preference, limitation, or discrimina-_________________________________

Lockney
4 BEDROOM, 1 bath, large lot, new carpet, 
two carports. 702 West U.S. Highway 70. 
652-2737.

tfc

YOU OWE IT TO 
YOUR FAMILY ...

See this immaculate
Brick home on pavement 

10 miles north of Lockney. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath, double 

garage and basement.
TTie Roberts ('ompaiiies 

293-44 i t
3009 O llon K(l., Phiiin icw

P U B L IC  N O T IC E

PUBUC NOTICE

The City Council of the City of Floydada will hold a Public Hearing at a 
Regular Meeting on Sq)tember IS, I9 ^ ,a t7 :3 0  p.m. in the Council Meeting 
Room at the City Hall, 114 W. Virginia StreeL Floydada, Texas, to consider 
and adopt the proposed City Operating Budget for the fiscal period beginning 
October 1,1994, and ending ^ptem ber 30,1995.

9-l,9-8c

PUBLIC NOTICE 
City of Floydada

Texas Community Development Program

The City of Floydada will hold a public hearing at 7:30 pjn. on September 1S, 
1994 at the City Hall, 114 W. Virginia in regard to the submission of an 
application to the Texas Department of Housing and Community Affairs for 
a Texas Community Development Program (TCDP) grant Topics to be 
discussed will include the application for water facilities improvement for the 
City of Floydada in the amount of $2S0,(XX) and the estimated amount of funds 
proposed for activities that will benefit low and moderate income persons. 
The application will be available for review at City Hall during regular 
business hours. Handicapped individuals that wish to attend this meeting 
should contact City Hall to arrange for assistance.

9-8c

POLICY OF NONDISCRIMINATION ON THE BASIS OF 
HANDICAPPED STATUS

The City of Floydada does not discriminate m  the basis of handicapped status 
in admission or access to, or treatment of employment in, its federally assisted 
programs or activities.

Gary Brown, City Manager,
P.O. Box 10 (114 W. Virginia Sl)

Floydada, Texas 79235 
(806) 983-2834

has been designated to coordinate compliance with the nondiscrimination 
requirements contained in the Department of Housing and Urban 
Development’s (HUD) regulations implementing Section 504 (24 CFR Part 
8, dated June 2,1988).

9-8c

MISCELLANEOUS

MISCELLANEOUS 
FOR SALE —  Sears Cold Spot 18 cu. ft. 
refrigerator, almond color. Call 983-2798.

9-8p

FLOYDADA COUNTRY CLUB M EM ­
BERSHIP —  CaU 794-1500 between 9:00 
a m . . and 4:00 pm .

9-15c

m o b il e  HOMES FOR SALE

DOUBLE WIDES 
'95 Models 

3 bedroom, 2 bath.
Only $264.05 per month.
FREE delivery and setup.

FREE tldning with homes purchased this month. 
Bell Mobile Homes. 

806-894-721^
10« DN-10.7S APR'240 tiaaim

9-8p

$1ZSO.OO DOWN & $240.09 PER 
MONTH

on '95 Model 16x80.
3 bedroom, 2 bath Qayton.
FREE delivery and setup.

FREE skirting with homes purchssed this month. 
Bell Mobile Homes. 

806-894-721X
S« DN-l ISO AFR*340 Minite ___

ROY REECER CONSTRUCTION —  
New homes, additions, home repair, ga­
rages, caiporta, steel buildings, rooCi, 
and demolition. Free estiinates. 296-2449.

10-27C

W ILL DO HOUSEKEEPING. 983-5153.
9-8p

W ILL DO INSIDE AND OUTSIDE house 
painting. For information call 983-2939 or 
983-6055.

tfc

WANTED —  Housework to do. Call 983- 
5351,

9-8p

TIM E TO  SPRAY your yard for weeds. 
Emeit Spraying Service. 652-3116 after 6 
PM .

tfc

GIBSON KS KEYBOARD A M PU H E R  
—  Lab Series. Like new. Call 983-2798.

9-8p

MUSIC LESSONS

DON’S M UFFLER SHOP - All types of 
exhaust work, pickup and delivery, free esti­
mates. We accept Discover Card. 210 W. 
California, Floydada, TX, 983-2273. Out of 
town call 1-800-866-3670.

tfc

^ECONOMICAL STORAGe ]
I TRY BARKER'S |
I Jewel Box Mini-Storage |
I and save your time and money. |
I Phone 652-2642 |
I  Comer Main A Locust Lockney, Taxae |
1̂  Barker Building j

DRUM FOR SALE— Used one year. 983- 
2082.

9-8p

MUSIC LESSONS —  Piano, organ, guitar, 
piano-accordion, keyboards. Lucy Dean 
Record, 807 W. Willow, Lockney. 652- 
2364.

9-15c

A LTER A TIO N S: For your alteration 
needs, see Florence at Mr. T ’s Cleaners. 
Hemming, zippers replaced, patching and 
other.

tfc

THOUSAND TRAILS MEMBERSHIP 
— Free to anyone who will pay transfer. Paid 
$6,8(X).00 nine years ago. No longer able to 
use because of illness. Home office is Lake 
Texoma with 42 campsites available. Call 
983-2798.

9-8p

REDUCE: Bum off fat while you a le^ , 
take OPAL tablets and E-Vap Diuretic. 
Available at Payne Family Pharmacy.

9-8p

LARRY OGDEN AUCTIONEERING - 
Estates, Farm, Ranch, Business, Liquida- 
doiu. State Licensed and Bonded. (806) 
983-5808. TX #9240.

tfc

Have a nice day!

' POOLE
WELL SERVICE

Complete Irrigation W eil Service. 
*$h)nitK»»s Spwd Bailing’'

407 £. Houston 
983-2285 983-5610

Bttgineib K e ^ n c e  j

i n m tJOffiV

Farm Equipment For Saie
1961 Gleaner Combine-14 f t 
1966 Chevrolet Truck 2-ton 
1953 Chevrolet Truck 2-ton 
(1) Full size combine transport 

trailer
1981 1480 International Combine- 

24 ft. header with hum reel 
18 F t Krause Offset

Call Byron Brock at 
652-2652 or 652-3527

Script Printing 
& Office Suppiy
* Commercial Printing 

*Offlce Supplies & Furniture 
"Business Machines

108 S. Main Floydada 983-5131

Seii your old treasures 
with a ciassified ad.

ADAMS
WELL SERVICE

Complete Irrigation Service 
5 Year Warranty, Domestic Pump

720 N. 2nd 
983-5003

Floyd County.. 
Hesperian-Beacon 

CLASSIHEO 
ADYERTISING - 
INFORMATION 

Rates are: 20 cents per wotd 
;f<jr the Orst ingertion

15 cents per word 
tor additicmal fons'''

A l/Lt C liA S S lF lE D   ̂
ADVERTISING 
m u$t b e p a id \
IN ADVANCE! T -  

Place your ad at: 
n i  E  Missouri In Floydada

102 W, Bryant In Lockney/ 
DEADLINE FOR 

PLACING CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING IS 

3:00 P.M. TUESDAY.

Probasco
Flying Service

Office at Floydada Municipal Airport

983-2314 or 983-5061
AERIAL PESTICIDE APPLICATION

Nights Call: Mitch Probasco, 983-2368, or Jimmy Cervantes, 983-2657

A com plete set 
of instructions 

for the first-time 
smoker.

DON'T.

statew ide Classified Ad Network. 
$250. Reach more than 3 MHiiON

Advertise In 315 Texas ncwsc 
Texans. Call th is ncwspiaper fc

BRANSON 3 DAYS 2 
nights Holiday Inn Crownc 
Plaza. $199 per person. 
Double occupancy. 3 
shows, Glen Campbell, Mel 
Tillis, Will Rodgers Fi^ies. 
1-800-893-1666othcrpack- 
ages available.
MOBILE HOMES FOR 
sale. We are the largest 
dealerin Texas. New, used 
and repos, 100 homes,ready 
logo 1-800-677-9896. 
EXPANDING in d o o r ; 
OUTDOOR swine produc­
tion units in Georgia seek 
livestock personnel. Send 
resume to: suite 448, 2351 
College Station Road, Ath­
ens, Georgia 3060S.
202 ACRES,$99/acre,gen- 
tly rolling West Texas 
brush. Deer, HucquaiLjav- 
clina, electricity. Good ac­
cess. 100 miles west of Del 
Rio. Sl.OOO/down, $216/ 
month (ll%-15yrs). 210- 
257-5564.
WOOD FLOORING 
SHIPPED direct from 
manufacturer. Save up to 
50%. Prices low enough to 
start a business. Call for in­
formation and pricing! 
Quantity discounts! 1-SOO- 
38-TEJAS.
EMUS: COMING TWO 
year old emus. $3,500each, 
male or female. Most hens 
drumming, males grunting. 
Chicks $800 each. Vet in­
spected , good straight birds. 
512-264-1979.
OLD GUITARS
WANTED. I am looking 
for old Fender, Gibson, 
National, Mosrite, Gretsch, 
Martin guitars. Will pay up 
to $10,ttX) for certain rrwd- 
eli. o il] Crawford White 1 - 
800-477-1233, Nashville. 
TN.
SUNQUEST W OLFF 
TANNING beds newcom- 
mercial-home units from 
$199. Lamps, lotions, ac­
cessories. Monthly pay­
ments low as $18. Call to­
day, free new color catalog, 
1-800-462-9197. 
DRIVER-PAY RAISE 
this month! Adding 1,200 
new tractors & 3,500 new 
Irailen. $750 experienced 
lign-on bonus. Call anytime 
- Burlington Motor Cani- 
eri; 1-800-JOIN-BMC. 
EOE.

DRIVERS / 0/0 • LEASE 
program - no money down. 
Must meet con^»any/DOT 
requirements. Late model 
walk-in conventionals. 
We're on the move! Call 1- 
800-927-0431. 
ATTENTION DRIVER 
TEAMS: $15,000in bonus. 
Paid monthly, quarterly & 
yearly, plus top mileage pay. 
401(K) plan, $500 sign-on 
bonus. Other paid benefits - 
Vacation -Health & life - 
Dead head -motel/layover - 
Loading & unloading. Cov­
enant Transport 1-8CO-441- 
4394/915-852-3357. solos 
and students welcome.
ECK MILLER EXPAND­
ING, need flatbed company 
drivers. All miles paid (new 
scale). Life/health, lider/bo- 
nus program. 23 years & 1 
year experience. 1-800-395- 
3510. Owner operators also 
welcomed! Please inquire 
about new ... opportunities. 
HAROLD IVES TRUCK- 
ING hiring drivers. Free 
driver training. Students wel­
come. Experience pay up to 
2Se per mile. 1995 conven­
tional KW’s here. Excellent 
benefits: 1-800-842-0853. 
DRIVERS: FLATBED 48 
State OTR. Assigned new 
conventionals. Cornpcdiive 
pay, benefits. $1,000 sign on 
bonus, rider program, flex­
ible time off. Call Roadrun- 
ner Trucking 1-800-876- 
7784.
FREE DEBT CONSOLI­
DATION. Immediate relief! 
Too many debts? Over due 
bills? Reduce monthly pay­
ment 30% to 50%. Elimi­
nate intcresL Stop collection 
callers. Restore credit. 
NCCS, non-profit. 1-800- 
955-0412.
YOU CAN OWN your own 
home! No downpayment on 
Miles iTUterials, attractive 
construction financing. Call 
Miles Home today, 1-800- 
343-2884, ex tl.
BREAST IM PLANTS, 
FREE registration foems and 
fieecocuultation.Csdl 1-800- 
833-9121, women and post­
im plant children. Carl 
Widdman, board certified 
personal injury trial lawyer, 
Texas since 1978. 
FRIENDLY TOYS AND 
gifis has openings for dem­

onstrators. No cash invest­
ment Part time hours with 
full time pay. Two catalogs, 
over 700 items. Call 1-800- 
488-4875.
WE INVEST IN you!!! 
When you invest in a Ser­
vice Master Franchise, we 
invest in you. We're the 
nation's largest professional 
cleaning company offering 
the best in training, equip­
ment and support. All you 
need is about $5,955 down 
plus working capital. Financ­
ing available. For free infor­
mation, call; 1-800-230- 
2360.
BECOM E A PARALE­
GAL. Join America's fastest 
growing profession. Lawyer 
in s tru c t home study. Choice 
of specialty programs offered. 
P.C.D.l., Atlanta, Georgia. 
Free catalogue, 1-800-362- 
7070, DepL LLK722.
HIGH SCHOOL AT home: 
by thcpopular homeschooling 
method. Fully accredited. 
Citizens High School. Call for 
free brochure, 1-800-736- 
GRAD (4723). Ext 12. 
AMERICAN LAND LIQ­
UIDATORS: Lots,
homesites, acreage/vacant 
land. For sale by owners 
across the country. Call for 
freelist 1-800-480-0090, seU- 
ers- 1-800-364-6612. 
ADOPTION: ABUNDANT 
LOVE, laughter, secure life 
await your newborn. Peace of 
mind for you. Loving father, 
stay at home mom. Allowed 
expenses. Wendy and John 1- 
800-727-9662. h'sUlegaltobe 
pout for a n tin g  beyond legal/ 
medical expenses.
ADOPT: OUR HEARTS 
filled with love, our home with 
laughter, security and abright 
future. Allowed expenses 
paid. CaU Shelley & Ian any­
time, 1-800-516-1378. It's il­
legal to be paid for anything 
beyond legaltmedical ex­
penses.
ADOPTION; A LOVING, 
well educated, healthy couple 
married 10 yean desires to 
give newborn fun, love, secu­
rity, and opportunities for a 
successful life. Legal/confi- 
dential. Call Helen & Dick 
collect 212-274-0075. It's il­
legal to be paid for anything 
beyond legaltmedical ex­
penses.

Before trekking off 
to college . . .

Before you head 
to the big city . . .

Be Sure and 
our special 
rates for 9-month
subscriptions to 
The Hesperian- ' 

Beacon.
Call or Come By Today!

I ll  E. Missouri, Floydada, 983-3737 
102 W. Bryant, Lockney, 652-3318
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Football Contest Rules
Any subscriber or Individual above the age of 7 years old who purchases a Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon is 

eligible to enter this newspaper's weekly football contest, except employees of this newspaper and family members 
living in the same household.

To play, circle on the official entry form, the numbers of the teams you believe will win this week's games. To 
indicate a tie, circle the numbers of both teams playing the game. In addition, write in each of the tie breaker footballs 
your guess of the combined total points to be scored by the two teams listed. Also circle the team you believe will win. 
Circle both teams if you think the game will end in a tie.

The only entries which will be considered for prizes will be those on official entry forms which are brought 
to the Hesperian-Beacon office in Floydada or to the Hesperian-Beacon Office in Lockney by 5:00 p.m. on 
Friday. No photocopies will be accepted.

NO MAIL ENTRIES WILL BE ACCEPTED.
Three cash prizes are offered each week. In the event of ties • the same number of correct games and equal scores 

on the tie breakers - prizes will be shared by those involved in the tie. The tie breaker scores will be utilized only in 
the event of a tie on the number of games correct

Print your name and address plainly on the official entry form and double check your choices before clipping 
out the entry form and depositing it at the Hesperian-Beacon office before 5:00 p.m. on Friday.

Entries are limited to one per person per week. Weekly winners are limited to one per household.

Floyd County Hesporian-Beacon Football Contest
Official Entry Form

Cut on the dotted line.

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14

15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 25 26 27 28

29 30 31 32 33 34 35 36 37 38 39 40 41 42

43 44 45 46 47 48 49 50 51 52 53 54 55 56

57 58

Tie Breakers
circle winner and write total combined score in football

Lockney
vs.

Petersburg

Floydada
vs.

Brownfield
NAME

ADDRESS, 

CITY____

WEEKLY PRIZES ARE:
WINNERS WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE NEXT ISSUE OF THE PAPER.

Floydada 
Power & Light

Uttlef/efd vs
^  Tulla *•

Woyd County 
Farm Bureau

Frlona vs.
®- New M e„eo 1 -  a

1 ST - $25 
2ND-$15 
3RD-$10

„ Higginbotham-
Partlett Lumber Co.

, l .o c V .» «
&

’ “ ' “  a  MS-

^ ' f e f i f h o u s e  
Ffectrie

Vs
'« - ^ a r v v f -'e// \ 1

J’iptonOij
^ t a t i e

2 0 .

Muncy 
Elevator

Road vs22. Dumas

Floydada 
^oop Gin

26. Louisville

City
^ U t o

^ ^ W a n e  „
« c »

^ k n e y M e a t
C o m p a n y

31. Baylor vs.
32. San Jose State

^gEquipment
Group

a

lAV

•s>
Service

Eambert 
Spraying

^1- Clemson vs.
42. North Carolina State

Brown
rn jp ie n ie n j

C o rtie ti'^ s
C o n o c o

Sponsor Needed
53. Broncos vs.

54. Jets

^ '• o c J tA f e a ,  
^ » » > P a o y * '

S s
ots

v%-


