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A view from
The 

Lamplighter

By Ken Towery

Judge McCov sets hearing on legality of sperf(il prosecutor

Cave and McPherson battle in civil suits
Here are our picks in a few selected 

races.
Bui first: No doubt all races are 

viewed as important by some people, 
particularly by those running for the 
office in question. Our comments today, 
however, will be limited to those races 
we view of extreme importance. In 
some cases they will be races that have 
not received as much allcnlion as they 
should, but which nevertheless have 
tremendous bearing on the kind of soci­
ety in which we live. In some cases our 
recommendations will amount to keep­
ing some people in office, and in some 
cases to removing some people from 
office so belter men, or women, may 
have a chance to serve us belter.

We will get rid of the easiest one first.
Jim Hightower ought to be retired 

from the office of Slate Agriculture 
Commissioner and Rick Perry ought to 
be elected in his place. In short. Perry is 
qualified for the office, and Hightower 
is not. Perry is an active farmer and 
rancher with three terms in office as a 
Slate Legi.slalor, one of our belter legis­
lators, we might add. He knows, and 
sympathizes with, the agricultural com­
munity. We could expect him to devote 
his energies to that task.

Hightower, on the other hand, has 
consistently portrayed a bias against the 
mainstream agricultural producers of 
this stale. His interests run toward the 
politics of politics. He thinks it more 
important that he devote his lime to the 
political fortunes of Jesse Jackson than 
the economic problems of Texas farm­
ers and ranchers. He will probably be re- 

I elected, but he ought not be reelected by 
* the voles of people who have an interest 

in seeing mainstream agriculture sur­
vive and pro.spcr in this stale.

Next, the Judicial races. These arc 
probably some of the most important 
votes we will cast. It is the Judges, after 
all, who interpret the laws passed by the 
Legislature, and in some cases make 
their own laws. Unfortunately the judi­
cial races arc somewhat “low profile” 
and escape the attention of voters.

In the race for Chief Justice we would 
recommend a vote for Tom Phillips, 
whose name can be found in the Repub­
lican column. He is a sound jurist, whose 
candidacy has been endorsed by a host 
of concerned citizens, including three 
former Chief Justices, all Democrats. 
His opponent is Oscar Mauzy, of whom 
little can be said, other than the fact that 
he is a political nut.

Also on the Supreme Court ballot 
will be John Cornyn of San Antonio. 
He should also be elected. He has the 
reputation of being a sound, conserva­
tive jurist, the kind we need on the 
Supreme Court. His opponent is a man 
named Gene Kelly, (not the dancer) who 
has neither the experience or qualifica­
tions to recommend him for the office. 
This loo is an easy pick, ll should be 
Comyn.

The next pick is a litlle more difficult. 
Neither is what we personally would 
like, but in the final analysis we will pick 
the Democrat Bob (Jamniage over 
Republican Charles Ben Howell for 
Supreme Court Justice, Place 2. Gam- 
mage is loo liberal, but Howell is too 
erratic for our taste. Pick Gam mage and 
hope for the best.

Next, the Court of Criminal Appeals. 
This is the Court that bears the responsi­
bility for turning criminals loose on 
technicalities. If you care about a little 
less “liberalism” in the uealmenl of 
convicted criminals, this is the Court be 
concerned with. As a group, the Repub­
lican candidates for positions on the 
Court of Criminal Appeals are far supe­
rior to those running as DcmocraLs. But 
there is one among the Republicans, 
Oliver Kitzman, who mo.st certainly 
ought to be elected. Not merely because 
he has the reputation of being a sound, 
conservative, hard-no.scd jurist, but 
because he is running against Sam 
Hou.ston Clinton, the incumbent, who
Continued On Page 13

Judge Bill McCoy, of the 358lh Dis­
trict Court, has set Thursday, Nov. 1, as 
the dale for the hearing on a motion to 
remove the special prosecutor. The 
hearing will start at 10:00 a.m. in the 
110th District courtroom.

This hearing stems from the motion 
filed by McPherson’s attorney. Bob 
Bass, on September 27, asking the court 
to vacate the order appointing a special 
prosecutor, that Judge Cave signed 
September 21.

On that date. Cave signed an order 
appointing William F. Wamick, an at­
torney from Lubbock, as a special 
prosecutor to “investigate and prosecute 
certain matters in which the District 
Attorney is not qualified to act ari.sing 
out of disposition of public funds under 
the control of Becky McPherson.”

In Bass’ answer to this order, and in 
his motion to vacate the above order, he 
said, “On August 16, 1990 Judge Ray 
Anderson, administrative judge of the 
ninth judicial region, recused Judge 
David Cave from “judicial acts related 
tolheconuoversy at issue in this cause...

Absentee balloting  
ends N ovem ber 2

“The 1 lOlh District Court is therefore 
recused from any acts that pertain to the 
Show Cause Order of July 
16,1990...any existing orders related to 
this controversy are ordered stayed 
pending further orders by the visiting 
Judge.”

Bass also said that the attorney Rush 
Wells (who is representing the auditors, 
Doyle & Love, who are currently in­
volved in the audit of the District 
Attorney’s records) and Mr. Wamick

(the special prosecutor appointed by 
Cave) share the same office. ‘This cre­
ates a potential for conflict.”

Ba.ss futher asks the courts, if it is 
shown that a special prosecutor is 
needed, that a “currently serving state’s 
attorney could be appointed at no costs 
to Floyd County. Such serving slate’s 
attorney’s are generally more familiar 
with the law related to grand juries and 
such appointment would be judically 
efficient.”

Judge McCoy is expected to rule on 
the above motions and may rule on the 
motions that have been filed since then.

DISTRICT ATTORNEY 
PRO-TEMS APPOINTED 
BY CAVE
On October 26, J udge Cave signed an

order appointing two more attorney Pio- 
Tem’s. According to the order,Cave felt 
that the District Attorney, Becky 
McPherson had forfeited her office as 
DA when “she accepted another public 
office (as county attorney)” and that a 
Quo Warranto suit should be issued 
Continued On Page 10

Caprock Hospital District 
secures temporary funds

Absentee balloting for the November 
6 General Election will end on Friday, 
November 2. Until that time, votes may 
be cast at the off ̂ce of the county clerk in 
the courthouse in Floydada.

Voting day for the General Election is 
Tuesday, November 6, with the polls 
opening at 7:00 am . Voters may cast 
ballots until 7:00 p.m. at their usual 
polling place.

At press time this week, 248 absentee 
ballots had been processed by County 
Clerk Margaret Collier.

The board of directws of Caprock 
Hospital District met for the second time 
in four days on Monday, October 29, to 
consider temporary funding to carry the 
facility through the end of 1990. Under 
discussion at the early morning session 
was a proposed loan from the Floydada 
Branch of the First National Bank in 
Lockney.

According to information discussed 
at the October 25 regular session of the 
board, the district is in need of operating 
funds to cover the period during which a 
$260,000 note payable to the First Na­
tional Bank of Floydada is being repaid. 
Current tax collections are being turned

over to the bank to repay this debt and 
are unavailable to meet operating ex­
penses until the debt is repaid. The por­
tions of current tax collections realized 
from the recent tax increase are being set 
aside in an escrow account in the event 
that they must be refunded if the upcom­
ing tax rollback election is successful.

Officials at FNB Floydada have de­
clined the district’s request for an addi­
tional short term loan or to allow the use 
of any lax collections prior to full repay­
ment of the current debt.

The loan negotiated with the 
Floydada Branch of the First National 
Continued On Page 9

Dedication ceremony slated 
for bank's 100th anniversary

"GOURD-EYED" PUMPKIN—This nmLsruil pumpkin was ca*’ved by Anne 
Jones, and submitted for judging during Saturday's Punkin Days. The eyes 
were gourd.s, the nose was a carrot and the mouth was a squash. The Floyd 
County Musuem registered 367 visitors on Saturday, and "a lot o f people 
didn't sign the book. There were a lot more people than last year," said Nancy 
Marble, "and they were all having a good time." Forty towns were also 
represented on the register at the museum. Staff Photo

Punkin Day attracts large crowd
By Alice Gilroy

The Punkin Days Committee, the 
Chamber of Commerce and the citizens 
of Floyd County outdid themselves 
again this year. If you made it to the 
square on Saturday, you saw Floyd 
County’s very best making the day a 
memorable one.

Crowds were gathering before the 
races started at 10:00 a.m. Booths were 
set up and the respective committees 
were busy with their jobs before the sun 
ever came up.

The games were the highlight of 
Punkin Days because of the opportunity 
for all ages to participate.

The races were well attended by run­

ners and watchers. This years Fat Man’s 
Race was very laid back for some run­
ners and a killer for others.

The good natured runners in this race, 
started their race across from Floyd 
County Farm Bureau and ran their first 
block to Scars, where they were to cat a 
piece of pumpkin pic as they ran to the 
next block.

To make sure there were no accidents, 
the men were led by the Floydada Police 
Department’s patrol car, and followed 
by a wailing ambulance.

Two of the runners, Clar Schahcl and 
Larry Ogden, decided that the ambu­
lance looked like a safer and easier way 
to travel. They could always slop at their

drive-ins and eat the food that was part 
of the race.

Some of the racers (who really ran 
hard) were disqualified because they 
forgot to stop at one food check point. It 
hardly seems fair does it?
Continued On Page 10

Floydada’s First National Bank will 
celebrate 100 years of banking in 
Floydada, with a historical marker dedi­
cation ceremony and reception, on 
November 4. The public is invited to the 
ceremony and reception, which will be 
held at the bank from 2:00 p.m. - 4:00 
p.m.

Banking in Floydada started in 
Johnson Bros. & Ainsworth Store in 
1890. The store was housed in the old 
Exchange Saloon building, which was 
the first building to be constructed in 
Floydada. ItsatontheS.W.comerof the 
public square. It was custom in those 
days for the owners of general mercan­
tile store to act as the bankers for the 
cowboys who needed a safe place to 
keep their wages.

Grand Jury indicts nine
Floyd County Grand Jurors indicted 

nine people, October 29, for various 
felony offenses.

Those indicted were: Gary Steven 
Anderson, 36, of Floydada, for injury to 
a child, a third degree felony, which 
occurred on September 28;

ADVANCE holds political rally
A modest, but interested, group of 

local citizens turned out Tuesday eve­
ning to hear spokesmen from various 
statewide races explain why their favor­
ites ought to be elected.

All in all, according to Jimmy 
Willson, who moderated the AD­
VANCE sponsored event, it was an in­
formative and interesting meeting.

None of the statewide candidates 
were able to make it to the meeting, but 
their spokesmen were on hand to ex­
plain their candidate’s position on is­
sues, and to answer questions from the 
audience.

Highlights of the evening, according 
to Willson and others who attended the 
meeting, were probably the presenta­
tions pul forth by spokesmen for candi­
dates for State Agriculture Commis­
sioner and U.S. Congress for this Dis­
trict. Candidate Rick Perry, running for 
the post now held by Jim Hightower, 
was represented by Steve Vcrelte, a 
farmer in Crosby County. Hightower 
was represented by Amonett Gaylon, 
also a farmer in Crosby County and an 
employee of Hightower.

Dick Watcrfield, the Republican can­
didate for the U.S. Congre.ssional seat 
now occupied by Bill Sarpalius, was 
reprc.sented by his campaign manager

David Crowder, while Sarpalius was 
represented by Aaron Alejandro, a staff 
assistant.

RoseMary Segura, running as a write- 
in for JP in Precincts 1 and 4, and C.L 
Mooney, running as a write-in for JP in 
Precincts 2 and 3, spoke briefly to ex­
plain their races.

Willson said he was pleased with the 
turnout of some40 people, and the inter­
est they indicated in the races.

“There were a number of other events 
taking place at the same lime,” he said, 
“but I believe it served a very useful 
purpose and those attending gained 
some additional insight.”

Absentee voting begins in tax 
rollback election at Caprock

Anyone who is a registered voter may 
vote in the tax rollback election at 
Caprock Hospital.

Ab.sentce voting in person began OcL 
31,1990 at 8:00 a.m. Tho.se wishing to 
vote absentee in person should come to 
Caprock Hospital. Absentee voting in 
person will be open until November 16, 
1990at5:00p.m. Hourseachday willbe 
from 8:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.m., Monday 
through Friday.

Ab.sentee voting by mail is in prog­
ress. Toreceiveaballolby mail you may 
send a note to Molly Stringer at Caprock 
Hospital, P.O. Box 540, Floydada, 
Texas 79235. In this note you must in­

clude:
Your signature (or a witness’ signa­

ture if you cannol sign):
You name and address:
Name of the election for which you 

arc requesting a ballot:
Why you are eligible to vole by mail. 
You may request a ballot by mail or 

phone. An application for a ballot will 
be mailed to you which you must fill out 
and mail back before a ballot will be 
mailed to you.

Absentee voting by mail will end on 
November 13,1990at5p.m. All ballots 
must be in the hospital mail box by 7:00 
p.m. on November 20,1990.

Servando Charles, 34, of Floydada, 
delivery of marijuana, a third degree 
felony which occurred on October 10 
and October 11;

Henry Rios Gutierrez, 41, of 
Floydada, DWI, which occurred on 
October 14,1990;

Ronald Lee Johnson, 43, of Floydada, 
DWI, which occurred on September 30, 
1990;

Ignacio Quintanilla, 80, of Floydada, 
possession of marijuana, a second de­
gree felony which occurred on October 
11;

Adelina Salomon, 31, of Oklahoma, 
forgery by passing, a third degree felony 
which occurred on August 16;

Katherine Shaler, of Mercedes, mis­
application of fiduciary property, a sec­
ond degree felony which occurred on 
Augu.st31;

Gilbert Lee Sinor, 36, of Floydada, 
DWI, which occurred on October 21;

Delma Ybarra, 27, of Michigan, for­
gery by making, a third degree felony 
which occurred on August 16,1990.

In county court, Victor Barrera, was 
charged Oct. 24, with driving while his 
license was suspended. He appeared in 
court on October 25 and his case was set 
for November 15.

Also in county court, Clinton Lamb, 
17, of Floydada, was charged on OcL 24, 
with DWI;

Adolfo Manriquez, Jr., 29, of Lub­
bock, was charged, on Oct. 24, with 
DWI and driving while his license was 
suspended.

On Oct. 25, the following people 
were charged in county court:

Larry Brown, 41, of Floydada, 
charged with DWI. He pled guilty and 
was fined $5(X).00 plus court costs.
Continued On Page 14

In 18%, McMannis and Posey bought 
out the Johnson & Ainsworth stock and 
became the “bankers” of Floydada. J.B. 
Posey, who bought out McMannis in 
1898, would take the money to Amarillo 
for deposit in the First National Bank. 
The banker in Amarillo convinced 
Posey that he should establish a bank in 
Floydada.

This private bank was called the 
James B. Posey Bank until 1900 when 
he was joined by L.T. Lester in estab­
lishing the Floyd County Bank. This 
was the name the bank carried in 1903 
when it was nationalized and became 
the First National Bank of Floydada 
with a capital stock of $30,000.00.

On November 27,1903, a charter was 
issued fro the Office of the Controller of 
the Currency, Washington, D.C., to the 
First National Bank, to commence the 
business of banking.

The originators and stockholders in­
cluded L.T. Lester, James B. Posey, 
John N. Farris, Columbus Suringer, 
Will W. Nelson, R.C. Andrews, and J.R. 
Burrus. Mr. Lester was named Presi­
dent, Suringer was named Vice Presi­
dent and Mr. Posey was named cashier. 
Dr. R.C. Andrews was named secretary 
of the board.

Then bank was located on Main Street 
between the Floydada Meal Market and 
J.T. Morris & Sons’ Cash Store in a 
building belonging to John N. Farris. 
The bank continued in this location until 
the fire of July 4, 1911, when it was 
moved to the lower floor of the tempo­
rary courthouse.

In March, 1909, the charter was 
amended to increase the capital stock to 
$50,000, necessary because of the rapid 
growth of Floyd County. A building site 
was also purchased from A.C. Bowers, 
lots 1 and 2 in Block 71, the southwest 
comer of the square.

In 1910, Mrs. Fannie Nelson was 
elected a director, and E.C. Nelson, who 
later became a president of the bank, 
was elected cashier. John N. Farris, 
W.M. Massie, and others put up money 
to buy the right of way for a railroad into 
Floydada, and the first train pulled into 
town in March, 1910.

In January, 1910, the motion was 
made to give bond for the money of the 
Floydada Independent School District 
for the bank, which established the first 
depository for the school district.

In 1912, FNB moved into a new brick 
two-story building, 25X50 feet, which 
was the largest building in Floyd 
County. John N. Farris had been elected 
president in January, 1911, a position he 
held until his death in December of 
1918.
Continued On Page 14
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To The Editor,
I really didn’t know where this article 

should be placed. In the thank you col­
umn, or the column about all the hospital 
business going on or in the accident 
column, ^ a u s e  it sort of covers all 
three, plus more.

It’s about the accident that happened 
Saturday during Punkin Day to our 
daughter, Shawnda.

We want all those in Floydada to 
know we appreciate the help and sup­
port and concern shown for Shawnda.

The staff here at Caprock and the

Letters To The Editor
ambulaiKe people and those at Method­
ist were just great! It was the type of 
accident which as they say - if it’d been 
an inch higher or over an inch “it would 
have done this or that” and that’s what 
made me think of the letter my duaghter 
wrote on the eleventh of Oct. ‘Two” 
weeks “before” the accident. She’s only 
seven so bare with her spelling. And this 
brought to mind the saying “Yes! Vir­
ginia there is a Santa Claus.” Well “Yes 
Shawnda there is a God.”

A Story About God!
By Shawnda Owens

By The Way m .

By Alice ^iilroy

Boy there were a lot of people in 
Floydada on Saturday. R ickie B urns and 
Nick Long both told me that they saw a 
lot of people in town that they didn’t 
know. That made me feel better, be­
cause I saw a lot of people I didn’t know 
either, but I always feel that way.

Nick was up on the stage keeping the 
crowd upbeat with his announcements. 
He said he would stop everyone that he 
didn ’ t know that came up to the chamber 
table. He would ask them where they 
were from and if they were having a 
good time. He said he talked to people 
from Dallas, Amarillo, Hereford, Lub­
bock, Abilene and Daingerficld—and 
they were all having fun.

Everbody outdid themselves. It was 
Floydada at its best and I personally had 
a blast. I was running around trying to 
take pictures of everything, and I 
couldn’t keep up with the committees. 
There was always something going on 
and I know I missed a lot of pictures.

The weather started out beautiful, 
turned very windy and then calmed 
down. The wind never seemed to 
dampen the spirits of those wanting to 
play.

The only ones who looked like they 
weren’t having a good time, were the 
cows at the Cow Patty Bingo. They 
certainly took their sweet time getting 
down to business.

I suggested to Travis Jones, that 
maybe we should hang a sheet around 
the pen for a little privacy. Maybe the 
cows would hurry up. • ^

After one of the bingo’s (which was 
extremely messy)! made the remark that 
“that was disgusting!” Somebody sit­
ting on the sidelines laughed and said, 
“Yeah, but what is worse is that we are 
all sitting around cheering it on!”

Juanita Stepp, who works at The 
Hesperian won $175.00 from the Bingo. 
What made all of us mad, was that she 
was the only one in the office that 
gripped about buying the tickets. She 
figured she was just wasting her money.

I personally am still holding out for 
the Publishers Clearinghouse.

Oh By The Way—Nick Long said 
that the same stuff used in the cow patty 
bingo was not the same stuff used in the 
Pumpkin Pic Relay Race (as some rac­
ers probably accused him oQ.

Nobody knows how many people 
were in town Saturday, but I do know 
that there were lots and lots. Somebody 
suggested about two thousand, and 
since nobody knows, we are going to say 
there were probably thousands.

If you don’t think there were that 
many—PROVE IT!

If you had a good time, please let the 
chamber know about it. They worked so 
very hard on the event, and all any of the 
organizers wanted in return, was your 
support (which they got lots oQ, and for 
you to have a good time!

1 know one thing for sure. There were 
plenty of people from out of town, that 
left here feeling good about Floydada 
and they WILL BE BACK!

For those of you who were worried 
about Shawnda Owens (she was the 
little girl hurt at Punkin Days)—she is 
OK. After a big scare and lots of X-rays, 
she was released from the hospital Sat­
urday night We all owe a lot of thanks to 
God that Shawnda wasn’t hurt worse 
than she was. It could have been tragic.

She was back in school on Monday 
and we are truly grateful.

My husband and I went to the dance, 
Saturday night at the Massie. It was 
supposed to be a costume dance. I 
dressed up in a SO’s costume and Lcnnie 
wore a leather motorcycle jacket, 
leather boots, sunglasses and greased 
his hair with vaseline.

We walked into the dance, and there 
was only one other couple there in cos­
tume (they were grateful we showed 
up).

I’ve never been able to get Lcnnie to 
dress up, and then when I did, this had to 
happen.

When we got to the dance, Lcnnie

looked around the room and said, “This 
is April Fools right?”

We had a great time anyway—and we 
easily won the best dressed couple!

********
Did you know that there is an ex- 

Floydadian running as an independent 
write-in for Governor. Her name is 
Evelyn Dehart Fain. She was bom in 
Floydada and is the Hrst cousin of Ster­
ling Cummings. Her mother is Beulah 
Cummings and her father is Mark 
Dehart That’s all I know about her. 
Maybe Sterling Cummings can recom­
mend her, but I don’t think he has talked
to her in a long time.

********

Mr. Samuel Rutledge wrote us a letter 
this week. It was such a nice letter. Of 
course we thought so, since he compli­
mented Mr. Lamplighter. He wanted to 
buy a subscription for one of Floydada’s 
boys in Saudi Arabia. He just wanted us 
to pick out one. We are sending Adolfo 
Garcia Jr., a subscription courtesy of
Mr. Rutledge. Thank-you.

******

Have those of you with kids ever 
spent your day looking for an insignifi­
cant toy, of no consequence to you, but 
of great importance to your child. It may

be just a piece of a piece of a toy, that 
doesn’t do anything, but if he wants it, 
then By Gosh you better find it. You 
crawl around on the floor—you look 
through the beds, under the beds, in the 
cushions, outside in the driveway, in the 
car, in your pockets, in his pockets, and 
in the dirty clothes. You get the picture.

Anyway—this week, my little boy 
went through that, but this time it wasn’t 
for him, but for his Papa!

That’s right. Papa lost his prize pos­
session. His hearing aid. A little bitty 
thing that blends real well with every­
thing.

Everyone searched the house—even 
Brandon. Brandon spent the day with 
his MeMaw looking everywhere and he 
knew it was real important to his Papa.

Finally, after everyone had given up 
and quit looking (already figuring in 
your head how much the replacement 
cost was), Brandon decided to comfort 
his Papa. He told him, “Don’t worry 
Papa. It will turn up. My hammeralways 
does!”

He was right. It did turn up. MeMaw 
found it in the very bottom of the kitchen 
trash, in a wadded up kleenex. Papa had
thrown it away accidently.

********

By the way—we aren’t going to have 
an election party this year, and we won’t 
put out the board this time. Sorry!

October I I ,  1990
1 lokt up abuv and sow sopthing in the 

clowd. It was God. He sade to me be 
brav, and don’t let eney body push you 
don. So I sade back, I will help every 
body I can but how can I help tham. At 
once he sad thank and I want to school 
and helpt everybody. After school I 
went oute sid, thar he aperd in front of 
me. I ran and trid to hug him but I went 
throo him. I sade I wish I cood hug you 
he said somday you will, thin he wint 
way! I sade will you be back, yes he said 
and wint away. The next day after 
school I went out sid, ther he was. He 
said. I’m redye to tack you with me sow 
I timd into a sparit and want 

The end. I Love God! He is sowe 
sweet!

Sincerely, 
Tim & Dianna Owens

r

The First National Bank 
of Floydada

Cordially Invites You 
To The

Dedication Ceremony 
and Reception 

Commemorating
100 Years of Banking in Floydada 

Sunday, November 4,1990 
Marker Dedication 

2:30 p.m.
Reception 

2:00 -4:00p,m.
124 South Main

V .

Dear Alice,
Thank you for all the articles that 

appeared in the Hesperian. Our recent 
Jail and Bail raised $2,500.00, with 18

jailbirds aifesied. The Match of Dimes 
thanks each person who participated in 
our Jail and Bail. Special thanks goes to 
Oden Chevrolet and their fine staff for

allowing us to use their showroom for 
our jail. Thanks to each prisoner and

Continued Oh Page 16

E)car Editor, --------------
The latest Pumpkin Polls have just 

been released by A.P. (Associated 
Pumpkins) and U.P.I. (United Pump­
kins International), and Floydada is still 
Number One due to our strong showing 
on October 27th during the 4th Annual 
Punkin’ Days. I’m sure all of the critics 
are giving Floydada a thumbs up rating 
of hospitality.

Approximately 50-voluntcers of the 
Punkin’ Day Committee and the 
Floydada Chamber of Commerce 
helped pull off this successful fun-filled 
day. But, there are two individuals I feel 
should be singled out and congratulated 
for their unselfish conuibutions— Juli- 
anne Cornelius and Alice Gilroy.

Alice did a top notch job of informing 
and motivating everyone if Floyd 
County with the many news articles in 
the Hesperian. But she took it several 
steps further and once again sent out 
numerous news releases to the Lubbock, 
Amarillo and many other news markets 
across the Southwest that eventually 
gave Floydada some priceless positive 
coverage. There is no way we can put a 
dollar value on this publicity, but thanks 
to Alice, Floydada is definitely earning 
the name of “Pumpkin Capital of the 
U.S.A.”

When the crowd of approximately 
3,000 showed up at the Floyd County 
Courthouse square, Julianne had her 
troups organized and ready to Show 
everyone a good time. The Punkin’ 
Days Committee put together a great 
schedule of events and had almost every 
angle covered for a memorable family 
outing. Julianne uses the TEAM (to­
gether everyone achieves more) method 
to perfection. She is a real pleasure to 
work with and is a great leader of any­
thing she undertakes.

While Punkin’ Days is fresh on 
everyone’s mind I feel its a golden 
opportunity to ask for support of the 
Floydada Chamber of Commerce. Your 
chamber is involved in many worth­
while projects, but Punkin’ Days alone 
warrants the support of every business 
and individual in this community. There 
are many towns struggling to find some­
thing to promote, well Floydada has 
found its claim to fame and something to 
work for.

Thanks Julianne, Alice and everyone 
involved in Punkin’ Days for showcas­
ing Floydada so well. If I did not already 
live in Floydada, 1 would move here.

Sincerely, 
Nick Long

Continuous Service 

Since 1890

1976 - Present

Looking Forward to Serving Floyd County During the Next 100 Years

^'Helping you cha nge thing* fo r  the b etter"

THEFIRST 
NATIONAL BANK 
OF FLOYDADA

Member F.D.I.C. _______________________

VOTE FOR

RANDY HOLLUMS

District Judge, 110th Judicial District
(Juez del Distrito, Distrito Judicial Num. 110th) Randy Hollums

DEAR VOTER:
Even though my opponent has indi­

cated that he is no ionger a write-in 
candidate for the office of District 
Judge, there is no procedure under 
state law to withdraw as a write-in can­
didate. I want to take this opportunity to 
ask you for your continued support for 
my candidacy. It is important that you 
actually vote for me in the November 6 
General Election.

REMEMBER - Be sure and mark the box!

Randy

Political Advertisement Paid For By Teresa Hollums Campaign Treasurer, 711 W. Virginia, Floydada, Tx 79235
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November 6

VOTE
Our Friend

r ICK

For

Commissioner

Agricuiture
Paid For By Members of 
The Floydada Volunteer 

Fire Department
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Parents warned of stamps 
laced with harmful drugs

Floydada Nursing Home Happenings
(The following article was submitted 

to The Hesperian as a public service 
from UPS managers.)

A form of tattoo thay may be called 
the “Blue Star” is being sold to school 
children.

The tattoo is on a small sheet of paper 
containing “Blue Stars”. They are the 
size of pencil erasers and each star is 
soaked with LSD.

The drug can be absorbed through the 
skin simply by handling the paper. 
There arc also brightly-colored paper 
tabs resembling postage stamps that 
have pictures of the following; Super­
man, butterflies, clowns, Mickey 
Mouse, and other Disney figures. Each 
is box-wrapped in foil.

This is a new way of selling acid by 
appealing to children.

A young child could happen upon 
these and have a “fatal trip”. It is also

believed that little children could be 
given a free “tattoo” by other children 
who want to have some fun by cultivat­
ing new customers without the child’s 
knowledge.

A “stamp” that may be called “red 
pyramid” is also being distributed along 
with microdots in various colors.

Another kind of “window pane” 
which has a grid that can be cut out is 
also being distributed. These are laced 
with drugs.

Everyone is asked to advice your 
neighbors, friends, relatives and chil­
dren about these drugs. If your child gets 
any of the above, do not handle them! 
These are known to react very quickly 
and some are laced with strychnine.

Symptoms include hallucinations, 
severe vomiting, uncontrolled laughter, 
mood changes, and changes in body 
temperature.

By Jo Bryant
We hope this finds everyone well and 

happy, and enjoying the fall of the year. 
The cool, crisp mornings, and the beau­
tiful colorful leaves.

Monday, Bro. Bill Wright came and 
shared the devotional with us, with Irene 
Wexler playing the piano for us. At 2 
p.m. the residents had arts and crafts. 
They made ghost. Rosie Rendon and

Thelma Hoffman helped us, we appreci­
ate you.

Tuesday, they had morning coffee 
and juice as usual. Shirley Varner came 
and helped serve. Dolores Cannon did 
the ladies hair and cut the mens. In the 
p.m. the residents had exercise.

Wednesday, was bingo day as usual, 
with Mary Alice Davis assisting us.

Senior Citizens News

Mammography service to 
be in Floydada Nov. 15th

The Mobile Breast Cancer Detection 
Unit of Odessa, Texas, which services 
Floydada, received the certification of 
the American College of Radiology 
Mammography Accreditation Program.

Mammography is an x-ray examina­
tion of the breast, which the American 
Cancer Society and other medical ex­
perts see as the best means for the early 
detection of breast cancer.

The program is voluntary and is de­
signed to insure that women received 
optimum quality mammographic ex­
aminations. The process is done through

The Floyd County Hesperian 
(USPS 2026-8000) 

Published weekly each Thurs­
day at 111 East Missouri Street, 
Floydada, Texas 79235. Second 
class postage paid at Roydada, 
Texas 79235
Postmaster: Send address changes 
to the Royd County Hesperian, 
111 E. Missouri, Floydada, 
Tcxas79235.

Subscription Rates: Floyd, 
Swisher, Briscoe, Hale, Crosby, 
Motley Counties - SI5.00; OthCT 
Texas Counties - $17.00; Out of 
State -$18.00.

a peer review evaluation of the facility’s 
staff qualifications, equipment, quality 
control and quality assurance programs, 
image quality, and breast dose. The 
accreditation must be renewed every 
three years.

Breast cancer will strike one in 10 
American women. The American Can­
cer Society predicts that about 41,000 
women will die of breast cancer this 
year. As there is no way to prevent the 
disease, early detection and treatment 
offer the greatest hope for survival.

The American Cancer Society recom­
mends that women do monthly breast 
self-exams and have regular physical 
breast exams by a doctor. It further rec­
ommends mammography on the fol­
lowing schedule:

A baseline mammogram (for refer­
ence) between 3S and 39.

A mammogram every one or two 
years between 40 and 49.

An annual mammogram from age SO.
The Breast Cancer Detection Unit 

will be in Floydada, on Thursday, No­
vember 15. You may call 983-2875 for 
an appointment.

Prayer Group of
ST. MARY MAGDALEN CATHOLIC CHURCH

will have a Turkey Dinner on Saturdayy November
11:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. at the Church Hall. 

Adults $3.00 Children $1.50 to eat in or take out 
Members o f the Prayer Group will be selling tickets 
All proceeds go towards Church Calendars for 1991

By Thelma Jones
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Reese had as 

their guest, her daughter from Dallas 
several days.

Mr. and Mrs. Kay Crabtree and fam ily 
have as their guest several days, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lige Moore of Alabama, Kay’s 
sister (Jo Crabtree).

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Goodnight have 
returned home from a trip to Alaska.

Peggy Medley was home for the 
weekend and Eulana Goodnight carried 
her back to Lubbock Sunday afternoon.

Sympathy to Beulah Baker on the loss 
of her sister; Floyd Webb on the loss of 
a cousin.

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Glover visited Mr. 
and Mrs. B. Hatley Sunday afternoon, B 
is home from the hospital and doing 
well.

Lula Teague and Marie Tardy went 
shopping last week in Plainview.

Everyone enjoyed the Punkin Day, 
Saturday, a large crowd attended.

Lucille Lobbin and granddaughter of 
Tahoka visited Mattie Wester last week. 
Also guest were the Hollis Paynes, Fri­
day night.

Mr. and Mrs. L.G. Pierce of Lubbock

Senior Citizens 
Menu

Nov. 5-9
Monday: Beef stew/vegetables, tur­

nip greens, combread, margarine or 
butter, apple cobbler, milk, beverage 
choice

Tuesday: Baked pork chop, baked 
beans, broccoli, rye bread, margarine or 
butter, pear halves, milk, beverage 
choice

Wednesday: Turkey or chicken pot 
pie, stewed tomatoes/cauliflowcr, let- 
tuce/dressing, whole wheat bread, mar­
garine or butter, cherry cobbler, milk, 
beverage choice

Thursday: Beef buirito, pinto beans, 
brussel sprouts, combread, margarine 
or butter, fruit cocktail, milk, beverage 
choice

Friday; Baked fish/creole sauce, lima 
beans, carrots, combread, margarine or 
butter, gingerbread, milk, beverage 
choice

spent Sunday afternoon with Mrs. Val- 
ree Turner. She is a niece of Mrs. Turn­
ers.

Joel Tardy and three sons Daniel, 
Kirk and Evan of Lubbock ate breakfast 
with his grandmother, Marie Tardy and 
Lanell and later attended Punkin Day.

Rebecca Smith has been ill with the 
flu.

Helene Holt is doing o.k. now, from 
breaking her arm.

Alma Rape has been back in the hos­
pital, also Nettie Lowrance to Alma 
home, Nettie to the nursing home.

Mrs. Nola Bishop is home from the 
hospital from having a freak accident.

Fall Harvest Savings 
HALEYS DEPARTMENT

at 
STORE

STUDENT WRANGLER now $9,99 
Cowboy Cut & Regular Fit

LEVI SOI'S - prewash - $21.99, prewash grey or black - $23,99 
"whitewash" or "instant old" - $29.99

JR & MISSES JEANS by Rocky Mountain, Chic, Cherokee, Silverlake & Levi
25% off

OCEAN PACIFIC Tops & Bottoms - Jr*s & Girls 
Long & Short Sleeve - 25% off

NEW SHIPMENT
KED%  STREET HIKES B o /s& G irP d  

Toddlers Size 6-10 reg. $34.00 HOW $19.99
Kids Size 10-6 reg. $38.00 now $24.99 

High or Low Top Leather Keds fo r Boys reg. $37.00 or $38.00 nOW $29.99

V -

Haleys Department Store
112 East California, Floydada

Henry Willis had the first bingo. The 
snacks and treats were candy, bananas 
and cheese balls.

Thursday, the residents continue their 
Halloween Art. They all made a mask to 
wear. At 6 p.m. the Lockney and 
Floydada Square Dancers came and 
performed for the residents. They really 
enjoyed them, and the music, “come 
again soon”, was their reply.

Friday, Freida Simpson came and 
played the piano, and also shared the 
word about casting all our cares on him, 
because he cares for us. Evelyn played 
the piano too, and closed with a prayer. 
On to Plainview on the bus ride.
McDonalds treated them to ice cream. 
Some went shopping at Wal-Mart.

Visitors: Willie Mae Smith, May Sue, 
Glcnna Sue, Frances Barnett, Roy and 
Tess Hill, Arlene Holmes, Pauline 
Robertson, Pauline Pierce, Roberta 
Hardin, Edith Muney, Dolores Cannon, 
Shirley Varner, Faye and Alan Benson 
and Boone Adams.

Thought
Children are small creatures who 

make their parents feel old and un­
strung. But also, make their grandpar­
ents feel incredibly young.

N ew
Arrivals

JARRETT
Vicki and Kelly Jarreu are proud to 

announce the birth of their daughter, 
Meagan Le Shea. Mcagan was bom 
Wednesday, Oct. 17, at 11:15 a.m. in 
Lubbock Medical Center. She weighed 
7 lbs. 10 ozs. and was 21 inches long.

Mcagan has a sister, Coutney and a 
brother, Joel.

Grandparents are Jean Jarrett of 
Floydada, Latricia Stephens of 
Floydada, and George Powell of Anna, 
Texas.

Great-grandparent is Retcher Powell 
of Anna, Texas

WESTER
Todd and Dawn Wester of Grand 

Prairie, Texas, are proud to announce 
the birth of their son, Dylan Hardy, bom 
at 2:23 p.m. Tuesday, Oct. 23, at Irvin 
Community Hospital.

Dylan weighed 8 lbs. 1 oz.
Grandparents are Ed and Jo Wester of 

Floydada and Travis and Bobbye Ray of 
Grand Prairie.

Shaklee Products
983-5246

► CANCER ■m

yup

ACCREDITED BY THE AMERICAN COLLEGE OF RADIOLOGY

BREAST CANCER DETECTION UNIT
a v a i l a b l e  t o  a r e a  w o m e n !

THURSDflV, HOUEHBER 15TH 
HERLTH FAIR

CflPROCK HOSPITHL DISTRICT 
FLOVDRDR, TEXAS

Call 983-2875 foF appointment
According to the American Cancer Socie­

ty, one out of ten wom en will develop  
breast cancer sometime in her lifetime. It is 
currently estimated  

that over 37,000 wom en die each year as a result of breast cancer.
N inety percent of breast cancers are  diagnosed by women or their physicians fin­

ding a lump in the breast. W om en who are diagnosed with a lump large enough to 
feel have a 50 percent five year survival rate. A woman who is diagnosed as having 
breast c a n c e r by m a m m o g ra p h y , b e fo re  a lu m p  can be fe lt ,  has a 97%  fiv e  year sur­
vival rate and a 90%  10 year survival rate. The cost is only J 6 0  i 0 0

A m am m ogram  can detect a cancer this sm all,#  even before it can be telt.

SEAIRS THRU NOVEMBER 21st ONLY!

p e n  Oiw-moo*i's 
supply of Swirs PUIS 
laundry dstarpont

Vote for the appliance you wont and 
you could win a $ 5 0  U .t .  5 A V IN 0 5  B O N D I 
PUiSs Get a $50 U S. Savings Bond with any 
purchase of $200 or more from our display floor

$65 LESS
Extro-lorge capacity wosher/dryer priced less ihon 
comporoble models. Only $15 MONTHLY* for the pair 

K e n m o r e *
2-spMd, 9-cyele wasW  4-tempwatwe dryw**

$399.88 $314.44
(E 28721) (E 68721)

SEARS
$379.89

$11 MONTHLY*

^  SAVE $20
20-inch color TV
• Remote Control
• Quartz tuning 

automatically locks in 
channels

• Up to 181 cable- 
compatible channels

(NU 30921)

K e n m o r e *  frosHess refrigerator
• Optional icemaker model available
• Adjustable shelves

$564.99 $16 MONTHLY*

a
SAVE
$48

(K 15585)

K e n m o r e *  dishwosfier
• 3-level wash • Power miser option

$318.85 $12 MONTHLY'

e f
SAVE $30 K e n m o r e ’
.8-cu. ft. microwave
• 650 watts
• Aceuwave Plus with stirrer fan 

AND turntable

$309.89
$10 MONTHIY* (JW 89721)

SAVE
$150
ConKorder

• Records sharp Images - 
even in candlelight!

• Includes telephoto lens, light, 
adapters, rechargeable battery, case

$799.99
$17 M ONTHIV (JW 53748)

S O N Y ' (NV 9332)

B ! (NV 20401)

PowerMote vac with
FREE PowerMote Jr. (o $49.97value!)
• 4.0 HP • Fingertip control

$ 1 99.99 $10 MONTHLY*

1 I
a _____  ._____ _
SAVE $100 Rock stereo system
• Dual cassette player • Remote
• CD adaptable

$514.98 $15 MONTHIY

■On SMnCharg* (or SoartChorgo PLUS crodH plan availabla on moal purchaaas KKakng $699 99 or moral Actual paymarHs dapand upon omong aoooun balanco SNeotno mdudad 
10 tio ro  "Eloctnc dryor roquroo cord Appllanoo* a rt wNM. odort antra Hama rtacMy availabla a t advartiaad Saa Mora lor warranty daUMa ^

100 South Main 
Floydada, Texas

CENTER
appu ances»electronics

WWrIpooly RCA A tm W
jx/

983-2862
(s t o r e  HOURS:
M-F: 8:30-5:30 - Sat: 9:00-12:00



Harmony Club members hold show and tell
By Doris Snodgrass 

The Harmony Extension Club met 
Monday, Oct. 22, at 2 p.m. in the club 
room in the Harmony Community Cen­
ter with Juanita Poole as hostess.

Vice-president Lucille Miller pre­
sided over the meeting in the absence of 
Maye Williams, president.

--------

Roll call was answerd by “Something 
1 look forward to in the future.”

Anna Maude Hopper read the minutes 
of the last meeting and gave the 
treasurer’s report. Ruth Scott gave the 
council’s report.

The council’s Christmas party was 
announced for Dec. 7.

Happenings at 
Caprock Hospital

By Molly Stringer
We had a good time with our bake sale 

on Punkin Day and appreciate all of you 
who supported us and bought goodies. 
We made $440.00. This will be used to 
buy material to redecorate the front desk 
area, buy a new vacuum cleaner for 
housekeeping and $100.00 will go into 
the nurses fund. We especially want to 
thank Beth Tye for baking some banana 
nut bread and Thelma Jones for her 
donation of money.

We continue to stay busy. Patient 
census is 11.

We have had a LOT OF ILLNESS 
among our staff. Otre of our nurses has 
been in the hospital. Several people 
have been in with pneumonia.

The Board of Director’s met in special 
session at 7:00 a.m. on Monday morning 
of this week. Attending were William 
Bertrand, Joy Assiter, Fred Thayer, 
Leroy Schaffner and Molly Stringer.

We are planning a Health Fair at the 
hospital on November 15 and 16. We 
invite all our community to come and 
participate in this. We will have a booth 
for diabetes, with information, videos 
and teaching. The mobile mammogram 
unit will be here and we arc now taking 
appointments, call the hospital at 983- 
2875 to schedule a mammogram. The 
cost will be only $60.00. We will be 
offering the following blood test: Cho­
lesterol, Glucose and Triglyaride, all 
free to ValuCarc members and a total of 
$5.00 for others.

We will have a table of goodies in the 
dining room and tables for visiting. The 
nursing staff will ha ve a booth for taking 
blood pressures and doing weights.

Health Information
Not only do people over age 65 use 

more drugs than any other age group, 
but they are more likely to use those 
drugs in appropriately as well. This can 
lead to serious side effects, such as diz­
ziness, confusion and loss of appetite, 
vision problems and unsteadiness.

The dangerous drug habits common 
to older adults include:

- Altering doses, possible to save 
money or because they feel better.

- Continuing to take medication 
meant for short-term use.

- Not telling the doctor every drug 
being taken. Avoiding drug misuse re­
quires watchfulness on the part of pa­
tients, families and physicians who must 
a.sk themselvbs these questions.

* Can fewer drugs be taken? Lifestyle 
changes, such as reducing dietary so­
dium, maybe a better option.

* Is the dosage correct? The standard 
adult dosage may be too high for some­
one who has grown smaller with age.

* Arc the drugs taken responsibly? 
Learn how the drug should be taken and 
for how long. Arc any side effects evi­
dent? If you observe any sign of a side 
effect or reaction, call the physician.

Remember that absentee voting is in 
progress for the Caprock Hospital tax 
roll-back election. Anyone may vote by 
coming to the hospital, to the office of 
the Director of Nursing.

The program was given by Vivian 
Curtis. It was a show and tell program. 
Each member bringing different articles 
most homemade. They also told some­
thing about what they brought

Donna Moore, a guest gave a demon­
stration on making lamp shades and also 
brought a lamp she had made of a quart 
fruit jar and demonstfated how it was 
made. .

Vivian Curtis lead the recreation.
Refreshments were served by the 

hostess to the following members and 
guest: Vivian Curtis, Ruth Scott, Anna 
M. Hopper, Bess Carr, Blanche Wil­
liams, Arvie Schulz, Karen Miller and 
children, Doris Snodgrass and the guest, 
Donna Moore of Petersburg, and host­
ess, Juanita Poole.

The club’s next meeting will be Nov. 
12 with Imclda Murry. Mary True, 
agent, will be presenting the program 
“Cooking For The Holidays.”

Caprock Hospital Report
Homer Farmer, Floydada, adm. 9-11, 

continues care, Lopez 
Leona McRay, Roydada, adm. 8-18, 

continues care, Jordan 
Viola Brown, Floydada, adm. 10-9, 

continues care. Hale 
Valerie Vick, Floydada, adm. 9-28, 

dis. 10-23, Hale
Willie Edwards, Floydada, adm. 6- 

15, continues care. Hale 
Lola Edwards, Floydada, adm. 6-15, 

continues care. Hale 
Flora Parvin, Floydada, adm. 10-15, 

dis. 10-17, Jordan
Josephine Rendon, Floydada, adm. 

10-15, dis. 10-20, Lopez —
Lee Campbell, Floydada, adm. 10-23, 

dis. 10-24, Jordan
Joshua Olguin, Floydada, adm. 10-

24, dis. 10-29, Lopez
Jean Thorpe, Floydada, adm. 10-24, 

continues care. Hale 
Ansclmo Trevino, Floydada, adm. 

10-25, dis. 10-27, Hale 
Nadine Harvey, Matador, adm. 10-

25, continues care, Jordan
Fannie McConic, Floydada, adm. 10- 

17, dis. 10-18, Jordan 
Frances Lowrance, Floydada, adm. 

10-17, dis. 10-20, Hale 
Essie Briggs, Floydada, adm. 10-17,

ENCOURAGE 
YOUR CHILD 

TO READ 
THE

NEWSPAPER

SAVE OUR 
HOSPITAL

VOTE
AGAINST

TAX ROLLBACK
Paid For By Friends of Caprock Hospital, Molly Stringer, Treasurer
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Local church makes plans 
for Annual Harvest Festival

Local United Methodists are busy 
preparing for the Annual Harvest Festi­
val Weekend scheduled for Nov. 4 and 
5. Craft items are being readied, pre­
serves and Jellies prepared, and final 
touches made on the just published 
cookbook “Methodist Menu Vol. II”. A 
book sale is planned for donated used 
books of all types and a “Woodworker’s 
Shop” will be open.

A traditional turkey dinner will be 
served Saturday at noon. The meal is 
being supervised by Bobby Rainer and 
“crew”, and prices arc $5 for adults and

$3 for children under 12. Both a take-out 
service and a “drive-thru” will be avail­
able.

This Harvest Festival offers area resi­
dents a unique opportunity to “Feast and 
Fellowship” with their Methodist 
friends and neighbors, and also do some 
early Christmas shopping.

Sunday evening’s concert by Mr. 
Randy Stevens on the Allen Digital 
Computer Organ promises to be a major 
highlight of the Fall Festival/Advcnt 
season.

This 'n’ That Hobby Club 
makes corn shuck wreaths

PUMPKIN TOTEM PO L E -T his 
unique totem pole made of painted 
pumpkin faces was found at Henry 
and Myrtle Finley's home.

“ Staff Photo

The This ‘n’ That Hobby Club met at 
the Lighthouse party room on October 
16, for their regular craft meeting at 
11:00 a.m.

Alpha Sigma Upsilon meets

dis. 10-18, Hale
EstellaNavarrete, Floydada, adm. 10- 

17, dis. 10-18, Lopez
Gomecinda Reyes, Petersburg, adm. 

10-18, dis. 10-19, Jordan
Kami Holbert, Floydada, adm. 10-20, 

dis. 10-24, Jordan
Lucille Poage, Floydada, adm. 10-21, 

dis. 10-22, Hale
Carl Lewis, Floydada, adm. 10-21, 

continues care. Hale
Doyle Carver, Floydada, adm. 10-23, 

trans. 10-24, Jordan
Catalina Delgado, Floydada, adm. 

10-23, dis. 10-24, Jordan
Alma Rape, Floydada, adm. 10-26, 

dis. 10-27, Jordan
Alta Duvall, Floydada, adm. 10-26, 

dis. 10-27, Jordan
Fidel Garcia, Lubbock, adm. 10-28, 

dis. 10-29, Jordan
Benny Vargas, Lubbock, adm. 10-28, 

dis. 10-29, Lopez

TX Alpha Sigma Upsilom, Chapter 
Beta Sigma Phi, met at 7:30 p.m. at the 
bank room on CX:tobcr 23. We had Rush 
with seven new potential members at­
tending. Donna Baer, Fern Hartsell, 
Debra Lloyd, Gerry Summers, Darla 
Chappell, Tammy Dorris and Beth 
Rittlc. Thanks for coming, we’d love to 
have you in our group. We had five 
members present and two members 
absent. A dinner of stack-up tacos, ice 
tea and strawberry short cake was 
served.

We Salute
HAPPY BIRTHDAY
Thursday, Nov. 1 - Ila White, Nelda 

Esquivel
Saturday, Nov. 3 - Barbara Hernan­

dez, Lisa Cradcr, Omar Eguia, Mrs. 
Joyce Williams, Jeffrey Lyles

Sunday, Nov, 4 - Carlos Mendoza, 
Angie McCormick, Ruth Crump

Monday, Nov. 5 - Kristal Wilson, 
Thbmas Warren, Tom Cope

Hope Warren brought the raffle, 
which was won by Donna Webb. 

Door prizes were given to our rush 
guest. We will hold our regular meeting 
on November 5, with Tonya Evans as 
hostess. Thank-you’s were exchanged, 
we said goodnight and we departed.

Anyone invited to our Rush is wel­
come to attend future meetings before 
making any decision. This invitation is 
open to anyone that was in attendance 
tonight or that had any conflicts but is 
interested in Beta Sigma Phi.

Tuesday, Nov. 6 - Mac McNeill, Jerry 
Livingston, Yolanda Trevino Garcia, 
Robin Galloway, Carol Cogdell Court­
ney

Wednesday, Nov, 7 - Ruth Gilliland, 
Wayne Wells

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY
Sunday, Nov. 4 - Jimmy and June 

McGaugli

All members brought a sack lunch and 
made a com shuck wreath. Each mem­
ber decorated her wreath in her chosen 
color and objects, such as miniature 
com, red peppers, dried flowers and 
ribbon bows. All were very pretty.

The vice president presided over a 
short business meeting. Plans were 
made to have lunch at The Olive Garden 
in Lubbock and attend a show, for their 
November meeting.

Attending were Mmes Sam Baker, 
Earl Crawford, Johnny Cates, Leslie 
Fawver, T.L. Holland, Royd Lawson, 
Glen White, John Wilson and J.B. Sue 
and guest, Cheryl Simmons.

r a  ' *

%

Happy 60th 
Wayne!

What's lurking 
in your air system?

'K. S

eACTERlA dUBT

MOLD
SPORES

j , . \ D U S T  ,

FUNGUS

POLLEN

AIR DUCT ClEAMINO
Removes the source off:

Dust • Allergy • Breathing Problems

( c l e a n in g . • se r v ic e )

“ Our Coal Is To Brighter^ Your Day

809 West 10th 

Plain view, Texas, 79072 

(806) 293-3532 

Call Today For Free Estimate

Permanent 
Electrostatic 

Air Filter

50% OFF
w ith a ir duct cleaning

Captures dust, pollen, 
mold spores

Coupon must lx  prcKnltd i t  time 
o( purchiK Not valid vnth any | 
other offer One coupon per ■ 
houaehold [ u It m  i i /i v m  '

V _____ r ________ ^

Professional 
Whole house 
Maid Service

FREE
w ith  a ir duct cleaning

A clean home is a 
healthy home

Coupon must be prewnted M time 
of purchaae Not valid with any 
other offer One coupon per 
household E«W rtt IV IV M  

V _____

Carpets 
 ̂Cleaned & Deodorized
I (Living Room. Hall k  2 BedroomsI

i FREE
. w ith  a ir duct cleaning
'  Treat your home's 2nd biggest

source of mold and bacteria 
UUNKM 

iiniiNUTioaM. 
O U lfn  DYIIM  

CliiMIM 00. 
Coupon must be presented at time 
of purchase Not valid with any 
other offer One coupon per

1 1

^lousehold E>a«rvf Il/IVM

Air Duct 
Cleaning Discount

20% OFF
Our complete service 

treats the source 
not the symptoms!

Coupon must be presented at time 
of purchaae Not valid with any 
other offer One coupon per 
household E ia lrn  ll/is/«a  ^

•} 1 / I *' -L...
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Flovdada leads district 2-3A with 3-0 record

Whirlwinds blitz Mules 44-0
By Bill Gray

The Floydada Whirlwinds continued 
their march to their second consecutive 
District 2-3A championship with a con­
vincing 44-0 route of Muleshoe on 
October 26. The Dimmitt Bobcats 
helped Floydada’s cause with a 27-13 
victory over Littlefield, knocking the 
Wildcats out of a tie with Floydada for 
the league leadership with two games 
remaining in the regular season.

Scoring at the rate of the Whirlwind 
powerhouses of the 1970s, Floydada has 
outscored its first three district oppo­
nents 97-6. Only Dimmitt has crossed 
the Green Gang’s double stripe this year 
in district action.

The Whirlwinds served notice in the 
opening minute that it would be a long 
evening for the Mules. Sophomore 
Michael Henderson returned 
Muleshoe’s opening kickoff 27 yards 
out to Floydada’s 41-yard line. Four 
plays later, Ruben Chavarria blasted 
through the right side, broke a tackleand 
sprinted 32 yards for Floydada’s first 
touchdown. Kenneth Collins’ conver­
sion kick split the uprights, and the 
Whirlwinds were on their way, 7-0.

Muleshoe picked up a first down on 
its ensuring drive before the ‘Wind de­
fense stiffened, forcing the first of nine 
Mule punts. Floydada managed two first 
downs on Collins’ runs of 18 and 10 
yards, but bogged down at Muleshoe’s 
46. Collins’ booming 45-yard punt was 
downed by Michael Aleman inside the 
hosts’ 1-yard line, putting Muleshoe 
with their backs to t̂ ie wall deep in their 
own territory.

Three rushes and a short Mule punt 
gave the 'Winds excellent field position 
at the Muleshoe 30. Michael Henderson 
carried 28 yards on first down, and two 
plays later QB Brian Teeple cracked the 
end zone from four yards out. Collins 
tacked on the PAT, and the first quarter 
ended with the‘Winds incommand, 14- 
0.

Floydada moved 45 yards in just six 
plays on its first possession of the sec­
ond period for another touchdown (the 
‘Winds rushed for four first downs in 
five attempts). Ruben Chavarria tallied 
his second 6-pointer of the night from 
eight yards out, Collins’ kick was true, 
and Floydada extended its-lead to 21- 
zip.

The Whirlwind defensive units were 
punishing throughout the game, and 
limited the Mules to 24 yards of total 
offense and only two first downs in the 
first twenty-four minutes of play. As has 
been the case most of the season, Fred­
die Portee once again led the defensive 
charge, and sacked Mule QB Galin 
Lathem for a 14-yard loss on the Mules’ 
drive following the Floydada score.

Jaime Suarez, Johnny DeOchoa, 
Jesse Rodriquez and Ramcro Rios all 
turned in superb defensive plays. This 
was the second district game in which an 
opponent failed to complete a pass 
against the Floydada secondary of Brian 
Teeple, Jaime Suarez, Kenneth Collins 
and Michael Aleman. A lot of the pass­
ing failures has to be attributed to the 
relentless pursuit of Floydada’s defen­
sive front and linebackers, but the 
‘Winds’ secondary has certainly come 
through in recent weeks in preventing 
any long gainers via the airways by an 
opponent.

A Teeple-to-Collins pass for 22 yards 
highlighted an 8-play, 38-yard drive 
which produced the Whirlwinds’ fourth 
score. Teeple passed to Collins off the 
option for the final three yards, Collins 
added the PAT, and the avalanche con­
tinued, 28-0.

Muleshoe managed its second first 
down on the next series, but could only 
move to the Mule 33-yard line before 
having to punt back to the ‘Winds. 
Teeple tossed forl8 to Jaime Suarez and 
for 16 to Chavarria as the half drew to a 
close. On the final play of the first half, 
Collins connected on his first field goal 
of the season, a 23-yarder, to extend 
Floydada’s lead at intermission to 31-0.

The “Spirit of the ‘Winds’’ Band was 
first to entertain at halftime. The band 
continues to perform well, polishing its 
performance in anticipation of the 
U.I.L. Marching Contest this week at 
Lubbock’s Jones Stadium. Regardless 
of the ratings handed down at contest, 
the FHS Band is something we can all 
once again be proud of — and, they did 
win the “ Battle of the Bands” at 
halftime. (I would say that for no other 
reason than their rendi tion of‘The G reat 
Gate of Kiev”!)

Muleshoe received the second half 
kickoff, but was unable to gain a first 
down, forcing Michael Hardwick to

punt for the sixth time. Billy Joe Villar­
real took over at quarterback as 
Floydada’s first unit offense didn’t snap 
the ball in the second half. There was no 
letup as the second-teamers continued 
Floydada’s total domination.

Keeping the ball on the ground, the 
younger ‘Winds drove 37 yards in four 
pla)B — with Quincy Johnson carrying 
the last five yards for the score. Andrew 
Cameron’s conversion kick was good, 
and Floydada’s blitz continued, 38-0. 
After an exchange of punts the Whirl­
winds maintained control at the end of 
three quarters.

Floydada’s only turnover gave the 
^all back to the Mules early in the fourth 
stanza. Muleshoe gained its third first 
down late in the final period, but three 
plays later Jammie Davis intercepted 
Mule QB Galin Latham’s aerial at 
Floydada’s 49-yard line. Davis rambled 
untouched for 51 yards and the final 
Floydada score. The PAT kick attempt 
failed and the scoreboard read: 
Floydada 44, Muleshoe 0.

As the clock ran down, Muleshoe’s 
John Orozco carried to the Whirlwinds’ 
47-yard line. It was to be the Mule’s last 
play and their deepest penetration into 
Floydada territory in the one-sided con­
test. The 3-5 Mules travel to Littlefield 
this week, with little hope of improving 
upon their winless district record. 
Floydada’s record improves to 5-2-1 (3- 
0 in district). The Whirlwinds host the 
Tulia Hornets at Wester Field this week 
in a game that will have a strong bearing 
on District 2-3A’s playoff representa­
tives. Kickoff is at 7:30 p.m.

BILL’S NOTES
The Whirlwinds continue to roll —  and at 

the right time. The ‘Winds quickly put to rest 
any ideas of a letdown after the tremendous 
effort against Dimmitt the previous week. 
Younger people are getting alot of play time, 
which will come in handy if the ‘Winds make 
the playoffs. Speaking of playoffs, Roydada 
could beat Tulia and wrap up a district co­
championship but still not be assured of a 
playoff slot.

The Muleshoe game was a blow-out in 
every respect. The 'Winds had over 200 
yards of offense in the first half, while hold­
ing the Mules to two first downs and less than 
30 yards. Roydada’s offense clicked all 
evening, producing the biggest point total in 
recent memory.

The Whirlwind defense is now playing at 
the intensity level it will take to control the
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next two ball games. Ruben Chavarria and 
Ramero Rios deserve special mention for 
their linebacking performances, as does 
Jesse Rodriquez, Lalo Delgado and Johimy 
DeOchoa for their defensive work. It was 
difficult to select the “Headhunter of the 
Game” this week, due to a number of out­
standing hits, but Freddie Portee again gets 
the nod for his sack of Mule QB Latham 
early in the second quarter. Good going, 
“Bullet”!

The Whirlwinds are scoring at an average 
of 21 points a game (166 in eight contests) 
and are giving up an average of 7 points a 
game (53 total). That sounds like a good 
point spread, so why don’t we Just say, 
“Roydada over Tulia — 21-7”! Bill’s other 
pics: Lockney, 28, Morton 6; Littlefield 33, 
Muleshoe 13; Childress 26, Dalhart 14; 
Canyon 14, Perry ton 7; Crane 35, Kermit 10; 
Slaton 40, Brownfield 20.

Upset Special: Motley County 33, Spur 
31.

Score By Quarter
Roydada 14 17 7 6 —  44
Muleshoe 0 0 0 0 —  0

Scoring Summary
F — Ruben Chavarria 32 run (Kenneth 

Collins kick)
F —  Brian Teeple 4 run (Collins kick)
F —  Chavarria 8 run (Collins kick)
F — Keimeth Collins 3 pass from Teeple 

(Collins kick)
F — Collins 23 FG
F —  Quirtcy Johnson 5 run (Andrew 

Cameron kick)
F — Jammie Davis 51 pass interception

‘ '•  . I . . - 1 1  .11.1 — =

(kick failed)

Game Statistics
Muleshoe

First Downs 3
Rushes-Yards 33-60
Passing Yards 0
Total Yards 60
Comp-Att-Int 0-6-1
Return Yards 128
Punts-Avg. 9-34.0
Fumbles-Lost 3-0
Penal ties-Yds. 2-10

Individual Statistics 
Rushing —  Roydada: Ruben Chavarria 

5-76 (2 TDs), Brian Teeple 10-52 (1 TD). 
Michael Henderson 4-40, Jammie Davis 5- 
40, Billy Joe Villarreal 7-37, Keimeth Davis 
7-32, Kenneth Collins 3-29, Quincy Johnson

6-27 (1 TD), Tracey Johnson 4-21. 
Muleshoe: John Orozco 20-53, Michael 
Chavez 2-15, Marvin Lewis 5-11, Galin 
Latham 6-minus 19.

Passing —  Roydada: Brian Teeple 4-7-0, 
59 yds., 1 TD, Villaneal 1-2-0, minus 7 
yar^.

Receiving —  Roydada: Kenneth Collins 
2-25 1 TD, Jaime Suarez 1-18, Ruben 
Chavarria 1-16, Quincy Johnson 1-minus 7.

Good Luck Winds!
Floydada vs. Tulia 

7:30 Friday 
at Wester Field!

Coach's Comments
By Coach Dean Bates 

We arc very proud of our efforts 
against Muleshoe. We executed very 
well on both sides of the ball. Muleshoe 
is a better football team than they were a 
year ago, and had played everybody on 
their schedule tough — so we were 
pleased with the margin of victory. We 
were able to play our second units a lot 
and they executed well.

We have two games left, and they are 
crucial games against very good ball

clubs. Tulia comes here Friday night 
with a talented team. They were the 
overwhelming favorite to win the dis­
trict championship. The Hornets have 
one district loss and cannot afford an­
other one, so we will get their best effort. 
The ‘Winds can control their own des­
tiny and they are preparing to take care 
of business. We will have a city and 
school-wide pep rally at the Junior High 
on Fridayat3:lSp.m. See you there and 
at the game for this important contest.
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Floyd County Hesperian $ 2 0 .0 0  In Cash Prizes Each Week
1st prize $10.00 2nd prize $6.00 3rd prize $4.00

A®
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CONTEST RULES
Any subscriber or individual above the age of 7 who purchases a 

Hesperian from a news rack is eligible to enter this newsp^ter’s weekly 
football contest, except employees of the newspaper.

To play, circle on the official entry form, the numbers of the teams you 
believe will win this week’s games. To indicate a tie, circle the numbers 
of both teams playing a particular game. In addition, indicate in the tie 
breaker football your guess on the total number of points to te  scored by 
the two teams listed. Also circle the team you believe will win.

The only entries considered for prizes will be those appearing on 
official entry forms and brought to the Hesperian Office by 5 p.m. on 
Friday. NO MAIL ENTRIES WILL BE ACCEPTED.

Three cash prizes are offered each week. In the event of ties • the same 
number of correct games and equal scores on the tie breaker, prize money 
will be shared by those involved in the tie. The tie breaker score will be 
utilized only in the event of a tie on the number of games correcL

In the contest to determine a season winner and the recipient of the $56 
prize, each contestant will receive one point for each correct game selected 
on the official entry form throughout the season. Running totals will be 
kept by the Hesperian and weekly scores published regularly.

Print name and address plainly on the official entry form and double 
check your choices before clipping out the form and depositing it at the 
Hesperian Office before 5 p.m. on Friday.

Entries are limited to one per person per week. Weekly winners arc 
limited to one per household.

OFFICIAL ENTRY FORM
Name.

2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20

22 23 24 25 26 27 28 29 30

32 33 34 35 36 37 38 39 40

42 43 44

TIE-BREAKER Circle winner and gues.s total score_

Floydada 
vs,

Tulia

(W rite

In
fbotlMD]

y  ^  ^
c<

Season winner earns: $56.00 cash prize
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Breezer footballers take 
two from  Mule shoe Mules

Floydada’s 7th grade Breezers tallied 
in every quarter, while holding 
Muieshoe scoreless, and blitzed the 
young Mules 28-0 at Muieshoe on Octo­
ber 25. John Mendez led the Breezers’ 
offensive charge with touchdown runs 
of 3,2, and 4 yards. Mendez also added 
a 2-point conversion. Amulfo Cervera 
accounted for the other Floydada points 
with a 55-yard TD scamper in the sec­
ond quarter.

The coaches named the following as 
outstanding players on offense: Alex 
Vallejo, Michael Mercado, John Men­
dez, and Amulfo Cervera. The defen­
sive stalwarts were: Tim Rando, Zach 
Abshier, Amulfo Cervera, Bobby Luna 
and Joe Sanchez.

The coaches stated, “We had a great 
defensive effort from the whole first 
defense. They were aggressive and 
played good technique in recording 
their fourth shutout of the year. The 
offensive unit showed good discipline 
and poise in driving the ball as it 
mounted four scoring drives of 40+ 
yards."

“The offensive line had a good outing 
as well in dominating the line of scrim­
mage. The 7th Breezers are really put­
ting it together in playing well on toth 
sides of the ball — and doing it consis­
tently. We hope to continue this im­
provement in our final two games at 
home. The 7th Breezers record now 
stands at 4-3 (2-1 in district), and will 
hostTuliaat5:30p.m. on November 1 at 
Floydada’s Wester Field. The 8lh 
Breezers vs. Tuliagame will start at 7:00 
p.m.

8TH BREEZERS 14,
MULESHOE 0
The 8th Breezers remained unde­

feated for the season (3-0 in district 
play) with a 14-0 blanking of 
Muleshoe’s eighth graders. Dimas 
Marmolejo scored on a 5-yard run in the 
second quarter. Bruno Mendez ran one 
yard for a touchdown in the third period,

Floydada 
School Menu

Nov. 5-9
‘ Monday:  ̂ .i.i, ,,,
'' Breakfast — Pineapple Juice, toast, 
jelly, milk

Lunch — Macaroni w/cheese, green 
beans, peaches, sugar cookie, hot roll, 
milk

Tuesday:
Breakfast — Grape juice, bacon, 

toast, jelly, milk
Lunch — Bar-b-q chicken, mashed 

potatoes, fried okra, pear half, hot roll, 
milk

Wednesday:
Breakfast— Orange juice, scrambled 

eggs, toast, milk
Lunch — Pig in blanket w/mustard, 

com, pickle spears, applesauce, milk 
Thursday:
Breakfast — Apple juice, pancakes, 

symp, milk
Lunch — Cheese enchiladas, sea­

soned pinto beans, tossed salad, 
combread, jcllo w/applesauce, milk 

Friday:
Breakfast — Pineapple juice, dry 

cereal, toast, milk
Lunch — Hamburger w/mustard, 

French fries, leUuce, tomatoes, pickles, 
ice cream cup, milk

with Pete Cooper picking up the two- 
point conversion.

The coaches stated, “Our football 
team played an excellent defensive 
game. We are very aggressive and are 
getting alot of players to the football. 
The defense was responsible for a 
blocked punt (Bruno Mendez) and two 
pass interceptions (Sammy Rodriquez 
and Dimas Marmolejo).

If we can eliminate a few mental 
mistakes, this team has a chance of 
continuing its winning ways. The 
coaches are very proud of the kids’ ef­
forts and hard work habits. This ties in 
with the success the 8th Breezers have 
enjoyed all year,”

Named as offensive players of the 
game were: Ian McIntosh, Peter Luna, 
Bruno Mendez, and Juan Martinez. 
Cited for their defensive play were 
Derrick Martinez, J.R. Quilantan, 
Jimmy Taylor, Rey Cuba and Dimas 
Marmolejo.
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R.C. Andrews PTA discuss 
memberships during meeting

, r-

LITTLE MAN - BIG HIT—Whirlwind cornerback Jaime Suarez stops a Mule 
for no gain in first quarter action at Muieshoe on October 26. Suarez was one 
of the defensive stalwarts as the 'Winds held Muieshoe to three first downs and 
60 total yards in Fioydada's 44-0 blanking of the Mules. -S taff photo

The R.C. Andrews PTA met on 
Monday, Oct. 22, President Debra 
Fawver called the meeting to order.

Treasurer’s reporter was given by 
Barbara Anderson. She reported their 
balance at $946.87 as of OcL 22.

PTA memberships were discussed. 
There has been 100% school board and 
100% faculty membership. Parents are 
encouraged to join and attend the PTA 
meetings. A party will be given in May 
for the classroom with the most parents 
attending PTA meetings during the 
year.

Judy Schacht, projects chairman, dis­
cussed the upcoming Halloween Carni­
val, which will be held Wednesday, Oct. 
31, from 6 to 9:00 p.m. in the R.C. 
Andrews gym. There will be a variety of 
fun filled booths and games for your 
children to enjoy as well as a concession

stand and spook house. All proceeds 
will benefit the R.C.A. PTA.

Mrs. Enriquez reported the 6th grade 
students will be attending Life Manage­
ment Skills. This is an excellent seminar 
on motivation and self esteem. The 5th 
grade students just finished taking the 
TAAS tests. The 4 th grade students 
recently went to the pumpkin patch and 
brought home pumpkins to decorate. 
GT students went on a camping trip to 
Quitaque.

Mrs. Crump’s 4th grade reading class 
performed an entertaining play entitled 
“Kids and Parents.”

The next meeting will be Dec. 3.

H a v e
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S e n io r S ta rs  of '91
By Alice Vargas

Our first senior star this week is Gra- 
cie Gonzalez. She is the 18-year-old 
daughter of Jose and Josefina Gonzalez 
of South Plains. She has five brothers 
and sisters.

For six years Gracie had attended the 
South Plains school and has spent the 
last six here at Floydada. During her 
high school days she has been a mem­
ber, vice-president, and secretary of 
Future Homemakers of America 
(FHA).

In her spare time Gracie likes to sew, 
read and watch her favorite T.V. show 
“Full House.” According to Gracie the 
best thing about attending FHS is being 
a “senior”. A thing she would like to 
change would be to have a longer lunch.

Gracie has much to offer FHS. She 
offers her friendship to all and is pleased

STACY HINSLEY

TEA Accreditation Team 
Schedules Floydada Visit

Members of an accreditation team from the Texas Educa­
tion Agency will be available Wednesday, November 14, 
1990, to meet with parents and patrons who have an 
interest in expressing their views and opinions about the 
Floydada Independent School District, according to Jerry 
Cannon, school superintendent.

Interviews will be conducted by team members beginning 
at 6:00 p.m. in the A.E. Baker High School Auditorium 
located at 618 South Tree Street, Floydada, Texas.

Every school district in the state is required by law to be 
visited by an accreditation team from the Agency to 
evaluate the quality of its educational programs and to 
determine what progress the school district has made 
since the last visit.

During the interviews, emphasis will be given to the 
quality o f instruction and community support present on 
each campus in the district. Areas to be evaluated by the 
team include planning, curriculum, instruction, services 
to students, instructional resources, personnel, govern­
ance, community conditions, and physical facilities.

%

by gifts that come from the heart. In the 
future she plans to go to Florida and then 
get married.

The second senior star is Stacy 
Hinslcy. She is the daughter of Kim and 
Sarah Hinslcy. She has one sister and 
one brother. She has attended school in 
Floydada for 12 years.

Stacy has also been very active and 
noticed at FHS. Her sophomore year she 
was in tennis. Her junior year she was

FFA Plowgirl and went to state and won 
third for her FFA Grecnhand Farm 
Skills team. For the past seven years, 
Stacy has been a member of 4-H. This 
year she is president of Floydada 4-H 
Club and is vice-president of the Royd 
Co. 4-H council.

Stacy’s future includes attending col­
lege to possibly become a counselor. 
Afterwards she hopes to find the man of 
her dreams and marry him.

It’s YOUR Money
By EDD V. HENDERSON, JR.

WILL YOU BE AUDITED?
Do you fear an IRS audit? Most taxpayers do. Yet those who have gone through the 
process report that, If not plea.sant, It Is certainly less awful than expected.
Your chances of audit are slim. Only a small percentage of returns are audited each 
year. Contrary to common opinion, the IRS does not choose its victims by occupa­
tion; however, higher incomes with more complex returns are more likely to get an 
audit
In addition to a random sampling of returns at every income level, certain other 
factorsmay trigger an audit: deductions much higher than the nom; any connection 
with a suspect entity, quite likely a tax shelter already under Investigation; dev 
lation between Income reported by a bank or broker and that listed on the return; 
and an allegation by an informant that something is wrong.
Most of the revenue agents will tell you what Is sought, usually documentation of 
certain deductions. It's wise to gather up receipts and cancelled checks for 
presentation In such an audit. Don’t bring EXTRA checks and receipts that may
prompt the examiner to look further. i. _____

Presented a.sa public service by EDD V. HENDERSON, CPA s 
201 W. California, P.O. Box 98, Floydada, Tx. 79235 806-983-3700

; = r  "Quality and Service at the Right Price”
ajjCCflraa'OTIMA fig - B/jBtTlIETT CO.

214 South Wall Floydada 983-2140

Keep Out of the Cold

Go with unbeatable unvented 
Dearborn Heater b y .. .

UJarm ntarning'
D e a rb o rn

Gas.
It’s A Natural 
For Economy.

nW hen it com es to heating your home or 
business, cooking your food or heating 
water, nothing does it better or more eco­
nomically than natural gas.

Heating with gas costs less, by far, than electric 
heat. Gas also out-perform s electric heat pumps. As 
it gets colder, heat pumps become less and less 
efficient. But, whatever the weather, the air flowing 
from gas heat is as much as 30 degrees warm er than 
heat pump air.

W ater heaters using natural gas far out-perform  
electric water heaters. On average, a gas water heater 
can save hundreds o f dollars in energy costs over 
five years. And, gas heats water much faster than 
electricity.

Looking to the future, gas may play a signifi­
cant role in vehicular use. It is estim ated that if 
only 10% of our vehicles were converted to 
natural gas in America, it could displace 700,000 
barrels o f foreign oil per day!

W hatever the energy job, go with gas. For 
econom y, it’s a natural.

EN ERG Y
Gas. It’s a natural.

A
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’Wind JV rolls over Muleshoe 30-6
r

>'• 4jk; «i»V; 4-- u. .ft.’

By Bill Gray
The Whirl wind Junior Varsity contin­

ued its winning ways at Floydada’s 
Wester Field on October 25 as they 
defeated Muleshoe’s JV, 30-6.

Gabino Suarez put Floydada on the 
board in the Hrst quarter with a 12-yard 
touchdown run. QB Keith Teeple 
passed to Suarez later in the quarter for 
a S-yard TD. Suarez scored his third

K A' N

FRF.SHMAN FOOTBALL TEAM •• Members of the 
1990 Fre.shman Whirlwind Football Team at the begin­
ning of the year included: (front row, left to right) Kevin 
Staples, mike Ochoa, Pete Jiminez, Israel Medrano, Rob 
Vela; (2nd row) Aaron Noland, Eddie Rodriquez, Rafael 
DeOchoa, Senon Hernandez, Tyson Edwards, Jessie

Gourdon; (3rd row) Jesse Segura, E rk  Smith, Peter Val­
lejo, Tate Glasscock, Troy Johnson, Gabriel DeLaFuente, 
Chris Bretas; (back row) Kevin Womack, Brandon 
Daniels, Tony Hernandez, Brandon Gilliland, Tyrone 
Henderson, Adam Gonzales and Joey Enriquez.

Photo by R Photography

Itti
APPLE OF OUR EYE for the week of 
October 22 was Mary Emert, an FHS 
graduate who has taught computers 
for 6 years. Her hobbies are sewing, 
cross stitch and embroidery. She is 
married to Weldon Emert, an em­
ployee of Lighthouse Electric. The 
couple has 2 children. Brad, 17, and 
Carrie, 14. Staff Photo

Ricci Gowens, granddaughter of 
Doncll and Wilma Gowens, has been 
nominated to be included in the 24th 
Annual Edition of Who’s Who Among 
American High School Students, an 
honor reserved for only 5% of the 
nation’s high school students each year.

Since 1967 the major objective of 
Who’s Who has been to recognize the 
achievements of the nation’s outstand­
ing students who have conuibuted to 
their schools and communities. Nomi­
nations for this award are received from 
over 14,500 high school faculty mem­
bers, scholarship agencies, youth club 
administrators and similarly qualiHed 
educators and advisors.

To make certain that listed students 
receive the meaningful national recog­
nition they have earned and deserve. 
Who’s Who is distributed to 15,(XX) 
college and university admissions offi­
cers, libraries, and high schools—insti­

tutions and individuals uaditionally 
interested in the achievements of stu­
dents. And, each year over 2,000 news­
papers publish articles announcing

Other valuable educational services 
for Who’s Who students include:

* The opportunity to compete for 
$65,(XX) in college scholarships. More 
than $1,100,000 has been awarded 
through this program

* The opportunity to use the College 
Referral Service (CRS) which links and 
refers Who’s Who students to the col­
leges and universities they are interested 
in attending. Who’s Who students may 
list their award on all future college and 
employment applications once their 
biography forms are returned and ac­
cepted.

* The opportunity to participate in the 
22nd Annual Who’s Who Survey of 
High Achievers, an in-depth poll of teen 
attitudes and opinions.

25% off all WAl.l.PAPER In-Stock
MARQUEE Christmas Ll2hts in motion, now in stock.

11-4

MASTER
MECHANIC

2 9 Q  While 
■ IL 9  sufiplies last

Knife & Scrapef Set
QUANTITIES LIMITED

B BW—HI at N1

ltlll|H|!l|
4 C n  While 

■ USI supplieslast
19-Pc. Power 
Screwdriver BN Set

QUANTITIES LIMITED

DAVIS & SONS
True Value Builders Mart

111 North Wall, Floydada 983-3113

To The Voters o f  
Precinct 2 and 3 

Floyd County
Responsible Government 

is needed now, 
from the Local Level 
to the National Level

Vote for
DOTTIE STANSELL

for
Justice of the Peace - Precinct 2 & 3 

Experienced - Dedicated - Concerned

touchdown of the game with a 1-yard 
blast in the second quarter. The three 
attempts for extra points failed, and 
Floydada held an 18-0 edge at halftime.

Jeremy Rubio scored on a 5-yard run 
in the third quarter and Suarez broke for 
a 23-yarder for a touchdown in the 
fourth quarter. Muleshoe managed to 
crack the Whirlwind JV’s end zone for a

harmless touchdown in the fourth quar­
ter. Neither team was able to convert on 
the point-after attempts following their 
touchdowns.

The outstanding offensive players for 
the JV ‘Winds were: Gabino Suarez, 
Ranee Pemell, Keith Teeple and Adam 
Gonzales. Named by the coaches as 
outstanding defenders were Josh 
Thayer and Rafael DeOchoa.

Gowens nominated for honor

-------- t-t>-

DUNCAN STARS for the week of October 22 were: (ftroat 
row, left to right) Marisa Barrientos, Jamie Chavarria, 
Cecelia Lopez, Brad> Rainwater, Chris W ickware, 
Johnny Joe Garcia; i2nd row) Amanda Barnett, Max 
Garza, Kelsy Pierce, Sam Holmes, Corey Hurt, Inez

Moreno, Ashley Hale, Rebecca W arren; (3rd row) Dustin 
Jones, Michael Chavarria, Jamie Garcia, Juan Gomez, 
Lindsey Reddy, Maribel Cuellar, Jim Peralez; (back row) 
Heather C arr, Kathie Graves, Kylan Snders, Jamie Davis 
and Frank Hernandez. Staff Photo

ATTENDS MEET IN GERMANY— 
Tasha Smith of Plain view attended 
the World Gymnastic Meet in Dil- 
lionburg, Germany, Oct. 17-20. In 
her class of 11-12 year olds she placed 
4th in the tumbling finalists and in the 
pre-tryouts for the mim-tram she 
placed 7th. There were 21 countries 
represented at the World Meet. She 
was accompanied by her mother, 
Kathy Pritchard of Plainview and 
grandparents. Dr. and Mrs. Keith 
Patzer.

Political Ad Paid fo r  by DottU Slansell

RICCI GOWENS

WRITE IN

RoseMary Segura
Justice of Peace

P re c in c t 1 &  4
Floyd County

Subject To November 6th General Election

Pd. Pol. Adv by RoseMary Segura, 518 W. Miss. Floydada, TX

IJest d rive  
th is  car loan

10.00%

Consider the standard equipment:
• You get a low rate—10.00% simple interest on new models.
• If your loan payments are automatically deducted from a Sunbelt 

account, the interest rate dips to 9.75% (APR).
• With qualifying credit, you can get 100% 

financing (excluding tax, title and license) on 
new ’90 and ’91 models—no down payments.

• You won’t be stuck with any interest penalties if you pay off 
your loan early.

• You can shop around for the best car value—with your loan 
already approved.

You also get these uncomplicated features:
• You can apply for the loan over the phone.
• You don’t have to be a current Sunbelt customer to qualify.
• You can borrow from over one hundred Sunbelt locations 

throughout Tbxas.

At Sunbelt Savings we believe in uncomplicated banking.
Hope you enjoyed the drive.

SunbeltSavings
N o  E x cu ses. A nsw ers:

FSB

©1990 Sunbelt Saving.s, fsb

Floydada - 217 W. 
California 
983-7325
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Reeves, Anderson and Mosley win 8th week of FB contest
Five entries in this weeks installment 

of the football contest missed only two 
out of 22 possible games on the contest. 
(Note: Due to an error in the listing of the 
Abernathy game, this game was treated 
as a freebie- no one lost a point for their 
answer.) Each of the five selected 
Floydada as the winner in the Floydada- 
Muleshoe confrontation, necessitating 
the use of the tie-breaker score to deter­
mine the winner.

Claiming first place this week was 
Mike Reeves. He chose 44 as the tie­
breaker score, hiding the exact total 
score on the nose. A $10 check for his 
share of the weekly purse will be waiting 
at the Hesperian Office on Friday.

Monty Anderson earned second place 
in the contest with a tie-breaker score of 
36, just seven points under the actual 
combined score. He will receive the 
$6.(X) check for his efforts this week.

Ricky Mosley chose a tie-breaker 
score of 3S points. He will earn the $4.(X) 
third place check for the week.

Honorable mention goes to the other 
entries that missed two games. These 
contestants and their tie-breakers were 
Andy Hale (34) and Terry Turner (30).

Also to be credited this week were 
those missing three games. They in­
clude Carrie Davis, Jana Davis, Laura

Hale, Sammy Hale, Sherry Hale, Keith 
Marricle, Jared Mosley, Brent Sanders, 
Clay Simpson, Susan Simpson, IDon 
Warren, Duncan Woody and Lucio 
Vasquez. Missing four games were 
Mike Anderson, Jammie Davis, Jean 
Hale, Joseph Henderson, A. W. James, 
Sarah Sanders, W. H. Simpson, Elisha 
Morris and Jennifer Noland

MAKE SURE ENTRIES ARE 
CORRECTLY nL L E D  OUT 
Entries need to be filled out properly. 
You may want to retain the remainder 

of the contest page to keep track of your

Hospital secures temporary funds
Continued From Page 1 

Bank in L^kney will provide up to 
$50,(XX) in operating capital for the dis­
trict until such time as current tax funds 
are available for use. The loan will be 
secured by selected accounts receivable 
to provide repayment. Repayment in 
full is due by December31,1990, on any 
amounts drawn.

The board accepted the loan and the 
terms as stated on a motion by Fred 
Thayer, seconded by Joy Assiter and 
approved by unanimous vole.

An account for operating expenses 
will be opened at the Floydada Branch 
of the FNB in Lxxkney.

Board members also opted to ask 
FNB Floydada to pledge securities as 
protection against loss on district depos­
its in the tax escrow account when the 
account balance totals $100,000 or 
more. This would protect the district 
from losses of amounts over $1(X),0(X) 
which arc unprotected by FDIC insur­
ance.

F*rcscnt for the Monday morning ses­
sion were William Bertrand, Joy As- 
silcr, Fred Thayer, Leroy Schaffner and 
Molly Stringer.

REGULAR OCTOBER SESSION
Meeting in regular session last Thurs­

day, the board heard a financial and 
statistical report from administrator 
Ixroy Schaffner. Schaffner stated, “We 
had a total of 319 patient days in Sep­
tember. This gives us an average daily 
census of 10 patients. In addition, there

were 174 emergency room visits and we 
treated 211 on an out-patient basis.”

Schaffner indicated that local physi­
cians have utilized the hospital facilities 
more in recent weeks, contributing to 
the improved patient load.

The profit and loss statement passed 
out to the board showed $116,139 in 
expenses for the month of September. 
Revenues totaled $160,408. The report 
also projected tax collections by the end 
of October would total an estimated 
$75,000.

The quality assurance report was 
brought to the board by Molly Stringer. 
The report’s focus is on the improve­
ment of hospital operation and services. 
Stringer told the board that new lab 
director Trent Wauson had identified a 
few areas in the lab which need im­
provement and is currently working on a 
plan for dealing with the deficiencies.

Representatives of Methodist Hospi­
tal met with the board to renew their 
pledge to assist Caprock Hospital in 
every way possible. Steve Grappe and 
Jim Bullard will be attending future 
meetings. Grappe told the board that all 
amounts due to Methodist including the 
administrators salary since February are 
being absorbed by Methodist Caprock 
will not be required to pay these debts. 
Grappe assured the board that his group 
was committed to rural health care and 
would work closely with the district to 
preserve their services in Floyd County.

Bullard and board member Fred

Thayer presented an outline for devel­
oping and implementing improvements 
in all areas of the hospital. Among the 
areas addressed was the business office. 
Policies to dictate procedure for admis­
sions, collections, bad debts, billing and 
accounts receivable are to be formulated 
and instituted.

The outline recommended regular 
meetings between the staff and the doc­
tors, the doctors and the board, and all 
personnel on a regular basis. The pair 
feel that increased communication in all 
areas would improve patient care as well 
as operation of the hospital in the future.

Other business handled at the Thurs­
day session included arrangements for 
workman’s comp insurance at a cost of 
$35,000 for the coming year, medical 
liability ($12,400) and general property 
insurance ($4,411) and boiler insurance 
($1,719).

Board members also approved the 
sale of a tax title lot to Kevin and Terry 
Nelson for $250. The property. Lot 1, 
Block 2, Bartley Heights Addition, may 
be purchased if other taxing entities 
involved agree.

Other items addressed included the 
reading of the minutes and a review of 
September invoices.

Present for the October 25 session 
were William Bertrand, Melba Vickers, 
Fred Thayer, Kenneth Pitts, Leroy 
Schaffner, Molly Stringer, Steve 
Grappe, Jim Bullard, Michael Benson 
and the Hesperian reporter.

OPEN LETTER TO THE VOTERS 
OF THE 84TH DISTRICT

September 28, 1990

Dear Friend;
In my travels throughout the district, I have had many 

questions about my support for Dick Waterfield for 
Congress. I will explain my position because I believe 
it is important for you to know why I have made this 
decision.
First and foremost, Dick Waterfield is a long time 

friend of mine. But, that is not the only reason I 
support Dick.
Dick is a farmer and works the land he owns. He is 

a cattle rancher and owns and manages a very large 
cattle feeding operation. He is presently serving as 
a bank director of the local bank. He has served on the 
school board as well as serving four years in the state 
legislature. He has served on the Board of Directors 
of the Abraham Nursing Center in Canadian.

I believe Dick to be uniquely qualified to serve the 
people of the 13th Congressional District because of 
his diverse background and I urge you to consider him 
when you go to vote on November 6.

Sincerely,

^^Warren Chisum
State Representative
84th District of Texas

Waterfield for Congress
Texas Values -  Texas Vision

Pd, Pol. Adv. by Waterfield for Congret*. Malouf Abraham, Treasurer, P. O. Box 15128, Amarillo, TX 79106

choices as you keep track of the games 
on the weekend. This will allow you to 
see how you did in picking the winners 
as the weekend progresses.

LEADING THE CONTEST
Duncan Woody has edged out Joy 

Allen for the lead in the race for the 
$56.00 season prize with 121 total 
points. Sammy Hale, A. W. James and 
Susan Simpson now hold the three way 
lie for the second spot with acumulative 
total of 120 points. Franklin Harris is 
alone in third place with 119 points. 
Next on the list are Joy Allen, Sherry 
Hale, Jared Mosley and Terry Turner 
with 118 points each.

Others in the running at this time 
include Andy Hale and Clay Simpson 
with 117 points, Mike Anderson and 
Mike Reeves with 116 points and Sarah 
Sanders with 114 pioints. Jean Hale, 
Willie Luna and Keith Manicle each 
now have 113 points. Wes Campbell, 
Sheree Cannon, Carl Lewis and Dcneen 
Marricle have 112 points while Johnnie 
Mosley stands at 111 and Sammy Bra­
dley, T. L. Holland, Ricky Mosley and 
Don Warren each have 110 points.

Everyone is urged to turn in their entry 
each week to remain in the running for 
the $56 final prize as well as the weekly 
money prizes being awarded. Remem­
ber, only one entry per person per week 
and only one winner per household per 
week.

CONTEST SPONSORS
Among those providing fulltime 

sponsorship for the contest arc Floydada 
Implement, Ray Lee Equipment, Don 
Hardy Car Wash, Floyd County Seed, 
R oy^da Co-op Gin, City Auto, Th­
ompson Pharmacy, Lighthouse Elec­
tric, Pay-n-Save in Roydada, The First 
National Bank of Roydada, Brown 
Implement, Our Place Drivc-ln, Davis 
& Sons Builders Mart, The Roydada 
Branch of The First National Bank in 
Lockney, KKAP Radio, the Floyd 
County Hesperian and R-Pholography.

Helping out by sponsoring on alter­
nate weeks are Script Printing and Of­
fice Supply, Nielson’s Restaurant & 
Catering, Quality Body Shop,Comclius 
Conoco, Dixie Dog, Don Green Auto 
Parts, Hale Insurance & Real Estate and 
Producer’* Cooperative Elevator.

Be sure to circle the number of the team Friday afternoon, 
you choose to win on the small OFFI- Let the sponsors know that you appre- 
CIAL ENTRY FORM on which you ciate their efforts in bringing this contest 
have entered your name and address at to you. Trade with them whenever pos- 
the top. Select a winner in the tie- sible and promote business at home in 
breaker game and enter your guess of the Roydada. These merchants and busi- 
combined scores of both teams in the firms contribute their time and 
little football provided. Clip out the support to many local activities. This is 
small square entry form and turn it in a chance to show your appreciation and 
at the Hesperian Office by five p.m. on support for them.
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^  6pk
COKES  

 ̂ $1.69 ^

^  3 liter ^
COKES  

 ̂ $1.69 ^
■
■
■

FREE 590 Fountain Drink j
. or Coffee with 8 gallons of Gasoline or more j
* BRING IN COUPON !

A
Try ourI CHICKEN LIVERS 

& GIZZARDS
1 DOZEN - $2.59 

1/2 DOZEN - $1.59

FREE 
16 OZ.

"A

FOUNTAIN
DRINK

W/Dinner J
CHICKEN DINNERS  

with Small Drink 
Dark Meat (Thigh & Leg).. .  .2.19 

White Meat (Breast & W ing).. .2.39
Dinners include:

Your Choice
Com on Cob - Potato Salad 

Cole Slaw - French Fries

CHICKEN FAMILY PACKS 
8 pc. m ix ed .. .$4.99 
8 pc. w h ite .. .  $7.99

TEXACO FOOD MART
102 South 2nd Street

CALL IN ORDERS AVAILABLE  
983-3090

A Message To

FLOYD COUNTY VOTERS

The National Congress is, and has for years been con­
trolled by Democrats. They determine the level of taxation, 
and who gets taxed. They determine the level of spending and 
who gets what. They vote their own expense accounts and 
their own pay raise. REMEMBER?

The Texas Legislature is, and for years has been, con­
trolled and run by Democrats. They too determine the level 
of state spending and state taxation. Their policies influence 
the level of local taxes you pay.

If you are happy with what Democrats in Washington and 
Austin have done FOR themselves and TO you, then vote to 
keep them there. But if you are unhappy and want to see a 
change - then VOTE TO MAKE A CHANGE -

VOTE REPUBLICAN
November 6

Political Ad Paid For By Floyd County Republicans, Kerry Pratt, Chairman

T
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Large crowds attend annual Punkin Day activities
Continued from Page 1

The winner of the Fat Man’s race, 
David Manley, played by the rules and 
was awarded the distinguished title.

The Pumpkin Pie Relay Race, the first 
ever for Punkin Days, provided some 
major obstacles that had to be overcome 
by the teams.

The idea was to run from Sues Gifts to 
Fred Thayer’s office while eating one 
quarter of a pie, hand off the pie plate to 
your team member who had to run back 
eating one quarter of pie. You had to 
keep this up with your four learn mem­
bers, until all the pie was eaten.

The problem arose, when right before 
the race, someone read the instructions 
on the ready to cat pies. OOPS THEY 
AREN’T READY TO EAT!

They were thrown into an oven at the 
Floyd County extension service office. 
They were supposed to cook an hour, 
and they didn’t quite get done. They also 
didn’t quite make it to the finish line. 
The gob of whipped cream on lop of the 
runny mess did little to disguise to the 
runners, what was underneath.

Before the race was over, there was 
orange runny gook all over the runners 
faces, clothes, spectators and the street. 
No one made it the finish line with 
pumpkin pie, because it promptly slid 
off the plate as soon as the first runner 
look off.

You knew there was going to be 
trouble when the announcer, Nick Long, 
said before the race began, “Uh, we are 
having a little trouble with the pic. They 
arc a little runny, just cat the crust!”

Speaking of runny stuff, the Cow 
Patty Bingo was a big success for the 
Chamber of Commerce and also for 
several winners. The first Bingo, which 
was worth $200.00 landed on a square 
that did not belong to anybody and so the 
money was added to the $500.00 first 
place prize.

The cow decided to splatter his sec­
ond bingo, which was then divided 
among two people. That went over so 
well, she then bingoed on four squares 
simultaneously. The $700.00 was then 
divided among four winners. (For a list 
of winners in all categories, see the

“Punkin Day” insert in this paper.)
There was a long wait on the bingos, 

and some were heard to comment that 
maybe the cows were slightly intimi­
dated bingo-ing in front of a cheering 
crowd.

The jail stayed busy once again, with 
prisoners carving pumpkins for their 
ticket to freedom. For some the freedom 
did not last long, as they were promptly 
arrested again.

Patience and friendships were once 
again tested in the famous Whccibanow 
race. I did not notice any husbands and 
wives teaming up and maybe that was 
best. Until roles are reversed, each team 
members will not truly understand what 
it feels like to drive a wheelbarrow 
through a maze of pumpkins blind­
folded. The navigators were heard 
shouting at their drivers and some were 
obviously frustrated that the wheelbar­
row wasn’t going where they were sup­
posed to go. The drivers also need to 
experience the joy of being dumped out 
of the wheelbarrow.

The pumpkin rolling, pumpkin carv-

Cave and McPherson battle
Continued From Page 1 
against McPherson. (Quo Warranto is a 
proceeding to determine if an official 
has the right to hold public office).

Cave then went on to order the law 
firm of Griffith and Glashccn, P.C. and 
the attorneys Thomas J. Griffith and 
Kevin Glashecn as District Attorney’s 
pro tern for the 110th Judicial District.

Glashccn and Griffith arc to investi­
gate the charges brought against 
McPherson by Cave, and to “exercise 
their offical discretion in that capacity to 
decide whether to institute an action in 
Quo Warranto to remove MePerson 
from the office of District Attorney.”

On October 24, Glashccn and Griffith 
took oaths to faithfully execute the du­
ties of the office of special District At­
torney l*ro Tern.

According to disuict records, Wil­
liam Wamick, also look the oath to 
execute the duties of the office of special

DisU'ict Allomcy Pro Tern, on October 
25.

Two days after taking the oath, on 
Friday, October 26, Glashccn filed a 
petition of Quo Warranto against 
McPherson, another petition seeking 
removal of McPherson from her office 
and a motion for emergency relief 
(which would ask for a DA pro-tem to 
fulfill the duties of the vacated office, 
while the suits were pending).

On Monday, October 29, Attorney 
Bob Bass filed his response. He urged 
the court to decline the Quo Warranto 
action, staling the order was void, be­
cause the appoinunent of the special 
District Attorney pro-tem was void. 
“The District Court is without legal 
authority to remove a district allomcy. “

The response says that the allomcy 
general or an agent of the state has to file 
an Quo Warranto and that Judge Cave 
had no jurisdiction in the matter. The

response further stated that the con­
tested order was entered in a manner 
which relates to matters in which Cave 
has been recused.

In rc.sponse to the petition for removal 
and the Quo Warranto, Bass stated that 
Cave had no authority to appoint special 
DA pro-tems. The answer further stated 
that the petition was not proper because 
the law requires a removal suit to be 
filed by someone who has lived in the 
county for six months and they must 
swear to the petition. Neither was done, 
according to McPherson’s attorney.

Bass further stated, “On Oct. 4,1990 
Judge Bill McCoy, visiting judge, en­
tered an order whereby an audit of the 
questioned funds would be undertaken. 
The present action for removal is prema­
ture and untimely until such audit is 
completed, in that many of the ques­
tioned procedures will be answered by 
the audit.”

Ann Richards visiting with Sheriff Joe Evans in Nacogdoches, Texas jaiL

Ann Richards’ message to criminals: If you  do the crim e, you’ll 
do the tim e. Richards will stop the outrageous practice of early 
parole for violent criminals. That is why she is endorsed by the 
Combined Law Enforcement Association of Tfexas.

Victims First.
Criminals Last.

Vote for Ann Richards.

Ann Richards
G O V E R N O R

Political Ad Paid for by Friends of Ann Richards, Lynn Marler, Treasurer

ing, pumpkin drawing, pumpkin bowl­
ing, and the great pumj^in toss kept 
children and adults busy and happy 
throughout the day. The games commit­
tee, Kyle Smith, Eric Cornelius, Nick 
Long, Bill Smith, Bobby Gilliland, 
Larry Ogden, Layne Kirk and Becky 
McPherson really need to be congratu­
lated. They worked hard to keep every­
one entertained, and they are respon­
sible for the majority of the fun that was 
hard throughout the day.

There were so many people working 
behind the scenes making the day the 
best “Punkin Days” ever.

No one got paid for their contributions 
to the day and many long hours were put 
into the event.

The city crew was up very early, on 
their own time, working at making the 
grounds ready. The stands for silting, 
the Vash cans, the marked off streets, the 
fixed electrical plugs, etc., etc., were all 
done courtesy of your friends and neigh­
bors that work with the city and the 
police department They deserve a great 
big THANK-YOU.

Visitors to the city were astounded at 
the family fun to be had all around them. 
Not only were they treated to Royd 
County hospitality, but they were also 
given free pumpkins to take home, cour­
tesy of Scott Faulkenberry, Ronnie 
Graham, and Marble Brothers.

Faulkenberry and Graham provided 
the pumpkins that were used in all the 
games, and in the Guess The Weight of 
the F^impkins Contest

Marble Brothers parked a trailer load 
of pumpkins near the square and offered 
them free to anyone who wanted one.

One visitor, from Dallas, couldn’t get 
over the fact that so many games were 
free and still lots of fun.

Herman J. Hoffman, of Panhandle, 
had so much fun last year when he 
visited our town that he came back for 
this year’s “Punkin Days.” He also 
brought some more of his large pump­
kins and he won the Largest Pumpkin 
entry for the second year in a row, with 
his 210 pound pumpkin. We want Her­
man to come back every year, but out 
growers are going to have to get some 
Pumpkin Capital pumpkins out there to 
beat Mr. Hoffman next year. (I’m sure, 
Brent Crossland, Wally Davis, Nick 
Long and Bill Smith will be more than 
happy to haul lots more pumpkins to the 
scales).

As everyone who was at Punkin Days 
knows there was one unhappy experi­
ence in the day.

When a crew was taking down the 
panels that made up the jail, one of the 
panels fell, knocking seven year old 
Shawnda Owens to the ground. One of 
the boys taking down the panel, yelled 
for Shawnda to watch out and she ran 
just far enough for the panel to miss her 
head, but it hit on her shoulder blade.

just below her neck.
She was immobilized, and in a lot of 

pain. An ambulance was called and she 
was taken to Caprock Hospital where X- 
rays were done. As an extra precaution, 
the doctor on call asked the parents to 
take Shawnda to Methodist for a Cat- 
scan. After more X-rays at Methodist, it 
was determined that a Cat-scan was not 
necessary. She was allowed to go home, 
by 8:30 p.m., Saturday night, and was in 
school on Monday. Shawnda was a very 
brave little girl, and everyone is very 
glad to hear that she is going to be OK.

But even with this accident, the com­
munity spirit of Floydada shone 
through. The family was overwhelmed 
by the calls from worried people want­
ing to help.

It doesn’t seem to matter whether it is 
a tragedy or a blessing, the citizens of 
this county always come through for 
each other. No where was that more 
evident than in the actions of those plan­
ning Punkin Days and those attending 
Punkin Days. It was a day that left you 
smiling and optomistic about the future, 
and visitors couldn’t help but leave 
Floydada with a good feeling about this 
town and its citizens.

Stop Money From  
Going Through the Roof! 
Insulate your Attic NOW
John Van Hoose 983-5101

A few words about the ^investi­
gation”  o f the ag department....

** T h e  M ach iav e llian  m o tiv a tio n s  h a v e  b e c o m e  o b v io u s . C o n s id e r , fo r  In ­
s ta n c e , th e  T exas F a rm  B u reau 's  v e n d e tta  ag a in s t H ig h to w e r....

I n  la te  1989, a u th o ri t ie s  c le a re d  H ig h to w e r  o f  a lleg ed ly  c h a rg in g  so m e  
m e a ls  a n d  o th e r  in a p p ro p r ia te  item s to  a  fed e ra l-s ta te  c ro p  in s p e c t io n  
se rv ice . B ut s ix  w e e k s  b e fo re  th e  M arch  13 p r im a ry , V e m ie  G la sso n , th e  
F a rm  B u reau 's  e x e c u tiv e  d ire c to r , u rg e d  h is  n a t io n a l  a ffilia te  to  p r o d  th e  
USDA to  in v e stig a te  H ig h to w e r again .

'W hat w o u ld  h e lp  Is a  Feb. 15 o r  so  C prlor to  M arch  13) a n n o u n c e m e n t ,  
o r  leak , to  T exas p re s s ,' G la sso n  sa id  in  h is  le tte r , w h ic h  w a s  fo rw a rd e d  to  
USDA. 'W e c a n  b e  su ccess fu l —  b u t a  little  s m a r t  p o litic s  o n  th e  p a r t  o f  a  
Y u e tte r-d ire c te d  USDA s u re  w ill h e lp .'

C la y to n  Y eu tte r, a  R e p u b lican , is th e  U.S. a g r ic u ltu re  s e c re ta ry .”
—  Austin  A m erican  Statesm an

Sunday, Oaober 28, 1990
^  T h a t [le tter] is as c lo se  to  a  s m o k in g  g u n  as I c a n  r e c a l l  N o o n e  s h o u ld  

b e  a b le  to  c a ll u p  th e  FBI a n d  say , 'I 'm  a  g o o d  R e p u b lic a n  a n d  I 'd  lik e  y o u  to  
in v e stig a te  a lle g a tio n s  £ ^ a in s t m y  o p p o n e n t '”

— Prof. David Anderson 
University of Texas School of Law

** T h e  fac ts  o f  th e  ca se  a rg u e  p e rsu a s iv e ly  th a t  th e  FBI h a s  a llo w e d  itse lf  
to  b e  u s e d  as a  p o litic a l h it-m a n  in  th e  ag  c o m m is s io n e r  ra c e .... A cting  o n  
th e  flak ie s t o f  g o ss ip , FBI o ffic ia ls  h a v e  c o n tin u e d  to  ro o t  a r o u n d  th e  A gri­
c u ltu re  D e p a r tm e n t lo o k in g  fo r  d i r t  At e v e ry  tu rn ,  th e y  h a v e  fa ile d .”

—  Dallas Times Herald
^  T h e y  k e e p  c a tc h in g  u s  w ith  o u r  p a n ts  u p !”

— Jim Hightower

...and about Hightower himself.
^  H ig h to w e r  se e m s  to  b e  a tta c k in g  e v e ry  p ro b le m  a t o n c e  w i th  u n d is c r im ­

in a tin g  v ig o r. H e g ives o f f  id eas  like  a  g r in d s to n e  g ives o f f  s p a rk s .”
—  Corpus Christi Caller-Times

“  T h e  e n t r e n c h e d  p o w e rs  feel a lien a ted . J im  w o n 't  g e t in  b e d  w ith
th e  g o o d  o l' b o y s .”

— Joe Rankin, President 
Texas Farmers Union

” C all h im  o u tra g e o u s . Call h im  c o n tro v e rs ia L  But c a ll h im  effective , to o . 
A g ricu ltu re  C o m m is s io n e r  J im  H ig h to w e r w o n 't  w ilt u n d e r  a  s t r e a m  o f  

ad jec tives. P a r t o f  H ig h to w er 's  e ffec tiv en ess  is b e in g  o u t f ro n t, 
p a r tic ip a tin g  in  th e  d isc o u rse  a b o u t a g r ic u ltu ra l p ro b le m s  

a n d  n o t Ix-ing a fra id  to  rufO e fe a th e rs .”
— Waco Tribune-Herald

”  H e (H ig h to w e r)  h a s  o p e ra te d  in n o v a tiv e  p ro g ra m s  a n d  h a s  d o n e  a  
firs t-ra te  jo b  o f  p ro m o tin g  T exas a g r ic u ltu ra l p ro d u c ts .”

—  San Angelo S tandard  Times

”  J im  H ig h to w e r  is th e  c lo ses t th in g  w e  h a v e  to  a n  e n v i ro n m e n ta l  h e ro . 
H e  is s m a r t  a n d  t o i ^ h  a n d  c o u ra g e o u s  e n o u g h  to  d o  w h a t 's  r ig h t .”

— David Zwick, Director 
Clean Water Action

”  J im  H ig h to w e r  h a s  led  a g ric u ltu re  in  T exas to w a rd  th e  b r ig h te s t  h o p e  it 
m a y  h a v e  k n o w n  in  d ecad es . H is v is io n  a n d  in s p ira t io n a l  le a d e rs h ip  h a v e  

p o in te d  th e  w a y  to w a rd  a  w h o le  n e w  fu tu re  fo r  a g r ic u ltu re  —  m a rk e t-  
d r iv e n , e n tre p re n e u r ia l ,  su s ta in a b le , h o s p ita b le  to  sm a ll o p e ra to r s  

a n d  fam ily  fa rm s  b u t savvy  in  th e  n eed s  o f  m a jo r  c o rp o ra t io n s .”
—  Dallas Times Herald

Political Ad Paid for by Floyd County Friends, Lynn Marler, Treasurer
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Aubrey E, Guthrie II holds first art exhibit at FNB during November

, 1

The First National Bank of Floydada 
is sponsoring Aubrey E. Guthrie II in his 
first one-man photography exhibit dur­
ing the month of November. This 
unique collection of the efforts of a 
Floydada High School graduate may be 
seen during regular banking hours 
throughout the month.

Organizer of theexhibit Martha Farris 
stated, “We are very proud to host this 
talented photographer’s first show.”

This Week
SUPPORT THE 
WHIRLWINDS
This week the Winds take one 

step closer to becoming District 
Champs. Once again we come up i 
against our big rivals, the Tulia 
Hornets. Kick off is at 7:30 p.m. at 
Wester Field. Everyone come out 
and cheer our team to another 
victory.

Swat the Hornets 
Varsity Cheerleaders

MARKER DEDICATION 
The First National Bank will 

commemorate 100 years of bank­
ing, with a marker dedication 
ceremony and reception, Sunday, 
November 4, from 2:00 - 4:00 
p.m. The public is invited.

PEP RALLY
There will be a school wide pep 

rally Friday, Nov. 1, at 3:15 p.m. 
at the junior high gym. Come out 
and support the Winds as they go 
for another district championship.

D.W.I. CLASS 
A D.W.l. Education class will 

be held in the Floyd County 
Courthouse in the District Court­
room on November 5 and 6, from 
5:00 p.m. until 10:00 p.m. the first 
night and 6:00 p.m. until 10:00 
p.m. the second night. The cost of 
the class is $50.00 for both nights, 
which must be paid on the first 
night of the class. This class is a 
required probation condition for 
the first time conviction of Driv­
ing While Intoxicated. If not 
completed within 180 days of 
conviction, the person’s drivers 
license will be automatically sus­
pended.

BAND BOOSTERS 
Band Boosters will meet Tues­

day night, at 7:00 p.m. at the high 
school band hall.

TURKEY DINNER 
Prayer Group of St. Mary 

Magdalen Catholic Church will 
have a Turkey Dinner, on Satur­
day, Nov. 3, from 11:00 a.m. - 
5:00 p.m. at the church hall. Tick­
ets arc $3.00 for adults and $1.50 
for children. Members of Prayer 
Group will be selling tickets. All 
proceeds go toward church calen­
dars for 1991. Eat in or take-out.

WEATHER
Courtesy of Energas

DATE HIGH LOW
Oc l 24 74 44
OcL 25 78 47
OcL 26 85 52
OcL 27 78 52
OcL 28 75 45
Oct. 29 76 50
OcL 30 83 52

Insurance 
that’s right 
for you... 

that’s \i1iat 
State Farm is 

all about. 9 9

CAIJ, ME.

Nick Long 
201 W. Calif. 

Floydada 
983-3441

scale I arm
Life h iM ira n e e  Company

M om eOITIn- Hlo<miinm<m. Mlinuis

Guthrie was bom in Clayton, New 
Mexico, on July 1. 1933 to a struggling 
young family doctor, Aubrey Guthrie, 
and his nurse-wife. Sue. He moved to 
Floydada at the age of two months 
where he lived for 18 years. While 
growing up in Floydada, Guthrie was 
primarily interested in athletics and 
horses. Yet, at about the age of twelve, 
he and Dan Hagood secured a darkroom 
kit for developing photographs which 
was the beginning of an intense and 
lasting interest in photography for 
Guthrie.

During his educational years, photog­
raphy took a back seat to his preparation 
for a medical career. Guthrie graduated 
from the University of Texas in 1955

and from Baylor College of Medicine in 
1959. After an internship and residency 
in family medicine, Guthrie began his 
medical practice in the Hurst-Euless- 
Bedford area where he continues to 
practice today.

Guthrie’s wife, Barbara, has just 
completed a Ph.D in Health Education 
and is a nurse with the Fort Worth Inde­
pendent School District. They have 
three children and three grandchildren 
with another grandchild on the way.

In the early 1970’s, Guthrie was able 
to seriously pursue his interest in pho­
tography. He began to enter photogra­
phy contests with some of his favorite 
photographs and spent hours at the local

junior college learning to develop black 
and white prints. Training in photogra­
phy came through the junior college 
courses, many workshop seminars, re­
searching through reading journals and 
books, and by taking hundreds and 
hundreds of pictures.

Over the years, Guthrie has tried sev­
eral kinds of art starting with pencil 
sketches, then watercolors, then oils. 
However, he never experienced the 
creative satisfaction which he has found 
in photography. Guthrie has received 
many honors and recognitions in his 
photographic work in local art shows, 
college photographic competitions, na­
tional medical magazines, the H-E-B

FBC hosting Drug Awareness Emphasis Sunday

Like a g(M)d nc-iuhl^or, 
State l arni is there*.

Nothing in modem times has so dras­
tically affected the total population 
morally and economically as the dmg 
epidemic in America. Current estimates 
indicate that over one-third of the fami­
lies in our country are adversely affected 
by drug abuse.

First Baptist Church is hosting a Drug 
Awareness Emphasis on November 4, at 
11:00 a.m. to assist in better understand­
ing of the personal and social impact of 
drug abuse in Texas.

This special Drug Awareness Empha­
sis will be conducted by Texas Alcohol 
Narcotics Education, the oldest preven­
tion organization in the state. The pres­
entation will be made by Phil Watson, 
who has been specifically trained to 
provide significant information and 
prevention alternatives for families.

Texas Alcohol Narcotics Education 
(TANE) provided materials and pro­
gramming for prevention strategies for 
individuals, families, schools, churches, 
community organizations and busi­

nesses. It is their belief that prevention is 
the only answer to the widespread prob­
lem of substance abuse. While treatment 
is necessary to assist those affected by 
addiction, in the end it is seen to only 
accommodate the problem.

TANE believes the drug problem will 
only be solved when public awareness 
and understanding reaches the level 
required to invoke the needed response 
from the whole community. First Bap­

tist Church is concerned that every ef­
fort be made to provide the community 
with the information necessary for each 
person to both understand the potential 
dangers of abuse to themselves and to 
ones they love and take the steps neces­
sary to prevent the spread of drug abuse.

Additional information may be ob­
tained by contacting First Baptist 
Church at 983-3755.

Harris Methodist calendar competition, 
and the State Fair of Texas.

When Martha Farris invited him to do 
a show at the First National Bank of 
Floydada he jumped at the oppoitunity.

“My mentor in photography, Fred 
Picker, has advised photographers who 
are learning and gro>ving to have a show 
no matter the quality of their work. 
Organizing a show is a way to learn 
about photography and about one’s own 
talents in particular. Through preparing 
the Floydada bank show, I have been 
forced to look at what my photographs 
mean to me intellectually and philo­
sophically rather than merely experi­
encing the joy of creating the pictures," 
states Guthrie.

“Doing this show has made me look at 
my photographs and allowed me to 
verbalize my own personal vision 
through which photography is the chan­
nel. When people see my photographs in 

—

the First National Bank of Floydada, 
they will notice that crosses, churches, 
flowers, and architectural forms domi­
nate the work. My quest in the practice 
of medicine and in photography, and, 
indeed, in life is the search for the Holy 
Spirit. In medicine, my daily prayer is 
that I might be a channel of healing and 
peace to anyone who needs me. In pho­
tography, I find the Spirit in the simplic­
ity of flowers, in the symbols of the 
church, and in man’s need to reach up 
into the heavens through the creation of 
beauty. A quote from C.S. Lewis sums 
up these feelings and ideas for me, Tf 
anything is spiritual, everything is,’” 
concludes Guthrie.

The photographs of Aubrey E. 
Guthrie II can be seen in the First Na­
tional Bank of Floydada during the 
month of November. He has £q>proxi- 
mately 40 color and black-and-white 
photographs displayed.

Goen awarded third in show
The Texas Caprock Arts Festival 

sponsored by the Briscoe County Ac­
tivities Association was quite success­
ful.

In the paintings and drawings divi­
sion, Jo Goen of Floydada won third 
with an oil painting. She also received 
honorable mention and merit awards.

David Reindlesbachcr from West 
Texas State University judged the show. 
A large number of area residents at­

tended the show and were highly com­
plimentary of the qual ity of the work and 
the manner in which it was displayed.

FARM SAFETY

DENA A. REECER

Attorney At Law
GENERAL CIVIL LAW 

Real Estate - Banking 
Probate • Estate Planning 

Business/Corporate 
Domestic - Litigation

201 West California 
(FCS Credit Union Building) 

Floydada, Texas 
983-5122

Not CtrtUW d bjr tk* Tom ftoard o f Ufil Sp«talkaUiMi

C E N T R A L  P L A I N S  R E G I O N A L . H O S P I T A L . W E L C O M E S

F A M I L Y  P R A C T I C E  A S S O C I A T E S

Ihe Wright Family Practice Associates, 

a unique practice shared between a husband and wife team, is committed to high quality, comprehensive medical care 

for the entire family including pediatrics, women’s health care with obstetrics and non-operative gynecology, sports 

medicine and minor'orthopedics, internal medicine, dermatology, and geriatrics.

* i

DR.  DAVI D WRI G H T DR.  RUTH R E C T O R - W R I G H T

.DavidWrighLa 
graduate of Plain view High School, obtained his 
medical degree from the North Texas Slate University/ 
Texas C(41egc of Osteopathic Medicine in Fort Worth. 
He completed his family practice residency training at 
the Womack Army Community Hospital in Fort 
Bragg through the University of North Carolina 
School of Medicine at Chapel Hill. Dr. Wright was 
then appointed as Clinical Instructor of Family 
Medicine for the University of North Carolina Schod 
ofMedicine. He also served as the officer in charge of 
a large family practice clinic for the First Corps 
Support Command at Fort Bragg. He was most 
recendy the chief of staff and family practice physician 
for the CIGNA Rcdbird Health Care Center of Dallas.

f. Ruth Rector-Wright 
obtained her medical degree at North Texas State 
UniversityTTexas College of Osteopathic Medicine in 
Fort Worth. She completed her family practice 
internship and residency at the Womack Army Com­
munity Hospital at Fort Bragg, North Carolina, 
through the Univwsity of North Carolina School of 
Medicine at Chapel Hill. Upon comjMetion of her 
residency program. Dr. Rector-Wright was named as a 
staff family physician and was appointed Clinical 
Instructor of Family Medicine for the University of 
North Carolina School of Medicine at Chapel Hill. 
Most recendy, she has served as the staff family 
physician and chief of staff for the CIGNA Irving 
Health Care Center of Dallas.

W
For appointm ent call: (806) 296-7888 
Office hours: Monday Friday 8 a.m. - 5 pjn.

Later hours are available on Monday and Thursday evenings by appointment.
Wright Family Pracdcc Associates • 2606 Yonkers • Suite 1 • Plainview, Texas 79072

Both Dr. Wright and Dr. Rector-Wright are board certified by the American Board Family Practice 
ondareFellows^the^nericanAcademy of Family Physicians.

-  /S f
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Directors attend state meeting

Time to check wheat fields forgreenbugs
C. Mark Brown 

Extension Agent-Entomology 
(PM)

Crosby/Floyd Counties
Now is the lime that producers should 

check wheal fields for greenbug infesta­
tions. In cool weather, the greenbug may 
increase to enormous numbers while its 
natural enemies multiply more slowly. 1 
have checked a limited number of 
Crosby-Floyd County wheat fields and 
have not found any insect problems. 
However, producers should keep an eye 
on the greenbug situation between now 
and the more severe winter months.

Greenbugs are aphids that suck plant 
juices and inject toxins into the plant 
while feeding. Adults are approxi­
mately 1/16-inch long and are pale- 
green with a darker green stripe running 
down the middle of the back. The lips of 
the legs and cornicles (tailpipes) arc 
usually black.

Several other aphids infesting wheat 
are often confused with greenbugs. The 
com leaf aphid is dark bluish green with 
entirely black legs, antennae, and cor­
nicles. The bird-cherry oat aphid is 
broadly oval and its color ranges from 
olive green to greenish black, with red­
dish patches around the base of the cor­
nicles. The Russian wheat aphid is pale 
green with an elongated, spindle-shaped 
body, and it has no apparent cornicles, 
and a “double tail” when viewed from 
the side with a magnifying glass.

Greenbugs reproduce rapidly at tem­
peratures between 55 and 95 degrees F. 
Greenbugs cause more damage when 
wheat suffers from deficient moisture. 
Greenbugs initially cause red spotting 
of the leaves at the point of feeding, then 
the tissue dies because of the toxins

injected. Greenbug damage may be 
confused with moisture stress and/or 
nitrogen deficiency.

When sampling for greenbugs, a 
minimum of five random counts per 20 
acres of field should be made, with each 
count consisting of one linear foot of 
drill row. Counts should be made during 
the warmest part of the day when 
greenbugs are most likely to be exposed 
on the above-ground parts of plants. 
During cooler periods, greenbugs may 
congregate in the loose soil at the base of 
plants, making detection difficult. If 
greenbugs arc numerous, estimate the 
number present

The need for applying insecticide 
depends on the number of greenbugs, 
size and vigor of wheal, lempcralure, 
time of year, moisture conditions, stage 
of growth, and effectiveness of benefi­
cial insects. Although it is impractical to 
specifically ouUine all conditions under 
which insecticides should be applied, 
the information in the following table 
should serve as a general guide.

delayed until it can be determined if the 
greenbug population is continuing to 
increase.

Low temperatures will slow the activ­
ity and effectiveness of most insecti­
cides, therefore, it will lake longer for 
control. It may take twice as long for an 
insecticide to kill at 45 degrees F as it 
would at 70 degrees F. For best results, 
apply insecticides when temperature is 
above 50 degrees F. If you must £̂ )pIy 
them when the temperature is low, apply 
the highest rale recommended.

COWPOKES

Leslie L. Nixon, Jr., JuniorTaylor and 
Leon Ferguson, directors from the 
Floyd County Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District, in Austin, October 22-24, 
1990 to attend the Fiftieth Annual Slate 
Meeting of Texas Soil and Water Con­
servation District Directors. The meet­
ing was held in the Hyatt Regency Ho­
tel.

Others attending from the Floyd 
County Soil and Water Conservation 
District were Jon J. LaBaume, District 
Conservationist with the USDA Soil 
Conservation Service, wives of the di­
rectors, Doris Nixon, Martha Taylor and 
Bill Ferguson.

James R. Moseley, Assistant Secre­
tary, Natural Resources and Environ­
ment, U.S. Department of Agriculture, 
Washington D.C.; Stale Senator Teel 
Bivins, Amarillo: State Representative 
Lena Guerrero, Austin; and Wes Oneth,

By Ace Reid

Plant height 
(inches)

3 -  6
4 -  8 
6 -1 6

Number of greenbugs 
per linear foot 

100 - 300 
200 - 400 
300-800

Occasionally, populations of 25 to 50 
greenbugs per foot of drill row in very 
young wheat may warrant treaunent.

Ladybcelles and parasites wasps, 
under favorable weather conditions, can 
reduce greenbugs populations to below 
the treatment levels given below. Where 
there are 1-2 lady beetles (adults and 
larvae) per foot of row or 15 to 20 
percent of the greenbugs have been 
narasilized, control measures should be

Wildlife packets and windbreak trees available from SWCD
The Floyd County Soil and Water 

Conservation District is now selling 
trees for the establishment of wind­
breaks around fields and farmsteads and

FIRST NATIONAL  
BANK OF FLOYDADA

Floydada 983-3717

RUSSELL'S
EQUIPM ENT & SUPPLY

R u s s e irs

Floydada 983-3751

FLOYDADA  
COOPERATIVE GINS 

INC.[COOP'
Floydada 983-2884

wildlife packets adaptable to CRP acres 
to establish wildlife habitats. Wind­
breaks are relatively cheap to install and 
maintain. They provide for multiple-use 
benefits such as beautifying the coun­
tryside and/or farmstead, reduction of 
energy costs for heating and cooling 
buildings, reduction of soil blowing, 
and establishes livestock shelters.

We encourage all CRP landowners 
who are incorporating wildlife habitats 
into CRP acreage to purchase a wildlife 
packet(s). A limited number of wildlife 
packets are available. They include 
quail and pheasant, turkey, deer, and 
squirrel. Each packet contains 4 species 
and 25 seedlings of each species (100 
total seedlings).

Trees will be sold at a nominal price 
through the Texas Forest Service. The 
seedlings arc grown at the West Texas 
Nursery in Lubbock and arc adapted to 
this area. Two new species added this 
year are the American plum and 
skunkbush sumac.

Conifers available this year include 
the AfghanLstan Pine (Bullet), Afghani­
stan Pine, Arizona Cypress, Arizona 
Cypress (Bullet), Austrian Pine, Pon-

dcrosa Pine, and Rcdccdar. Conifers 
will be sold for $60.00 for 40 seedlings 
plus tax. Bullets will be sold for $30.00 
for 30 seedlings plus tax. We will accept 
a minimum order of 20 seedlings.

Hardwoods available this year in­
clude American plum, Calalpa, Cotton­
wood cuttings. Desert willow, Green 
ash, Honcylocust, Little walnut, Osage 
orange. Pecan, Red oak, Russian Olive, 
Sandcherry, and Skunkbush sumac. 
Hardwoods will be sold for $35.00 for 
100 seedlings plus lax. We will accept a 
minimum order of 25 seedlings per 
species.

Tree orders are now being taken at the 
Soil Conservation Service Office in 
Roydada. The SWCD Board will con­
tinue to sell tree seedlings upon their 
availability until March 1, 1990. All 
orders are filled on a first-come first- 
serve basis. Be sure to get your order in 
early to get the seedlings you desire 
most. These trees arc made available to 
all Soil and Water Conservation Dis­
tricts in this area and the supply is lim­
ited.

For information and order placement, 
contact your local Soil Conservation 
Service, Roydada Field Office, USDA

Building, Highway 70 East, phone 
number 983-2352.

State Conservationist, USDA Soil Con­
servation Service, Temple were speak­
ers that highlighted the program of the 
Fiftieth Annual Stale Meeting of Soil 
and Water Conservation District Direc­
tors.

The purpose of the meeting was to 
review developments affecting state 
and national conservation programs.

Approximately 1,200 SWCD direc­
tors and other conservation leaders at­
tended the meeting.

Speaking at the Tuesday morning 
general session were Assistant Secre­
tary Moseley, Senator Bivins, and Rep­
resentative Guerrero. Moseley is re­
sponsible for directing the policies and 
supervising the activities and programs 
of the Forest SeiA'ice and Soil Conserva­
tion Service. Prior to his current posi­
tion, Moseley served as Agricultural 
Advisor to the Administrator of the 
Environmental Protection Agency on 
issues affecting the agricultural indus­
try.

A rancher and businessman. Senator 
Bivins currently serves on the Eco­
nomic Development Committee, the 
Natural Resources Committee and the 
Jurisprudence Commiuee. Bivins’ 31st 
Senatorial District covers 29 counties in 
the Panhandle and South Plains.

Representative Guerrero, who serves 
as Vice Chair of the Slate Affairs Com­
mittee, and as a member of the 
Committee’s Budget and Oversight 
Subcommittee, will welcome the con­
servation district officials. She is also 
expected to give an overview of issues 
the next regular session of the Legisla­
ture will be confronting.

During the general session, the Texas 
State Soil and Water Conservation 
Board will report on a study concerning 
the conditions of Texas watersheds rela­
tive to their physical conditions and how 
these conditions relate to water quality 
and quantity.

Oneth addressed the con.servalion 
district officials on Soil Conservation 
Service assistance to Texas SWCDs. He 
also talked about the agency’s budget 
ouUook for fiscal year 1991 as it relates 
to conservation programs in the state.

Clyde Hale of Sherman, president. 
Association of Texas Soil and Water 
Conservation Districts also addressed 
the group on Tuesday morning.

Five workshops were held on Tues­

day afternoon. The district operations 
workshops were primarily a training 
session for district directors and district 
employees concerning day-to-day op­
erations of districts.

In the education/informalion work­
shops, discussions were focused on 
improving communications among 
TSSWCB, SCS and district officials. A 
representative from the Texas Educa­
tion Agency talked on how SWCDs may 
apply for and obtain approval for locally 
developed conservation education pro­
grams.

The agricultural and silvicultural 
nonpointsource management workshop 
involved detailed discussions of the 
draft results of the statewide watershed 
study. Talk also centered on an indepth 
explanation of the 1990 agricultural/ 
silvicultural nonpoint source pollution 
assessment program.

In the legislative issues workshop, a 
panel of Legislative Leaders discussed 
legislation expected to be introduced in 
the upcoming session which could af­
fect Texas Conservation Programs.

A presentation on the formation of 
underground water conservation dis­
tricts with a discussion on the activities 
of UWCDs were focus of the under­
ground water districts workshop.

Farm /Ranch Insurance
Nick Long 

201 W. C»lif., Roydada
983-3441

Stale Farm and Canialty Cocyany 
Hof» OflicB, BloonungUn, Dlinais

FLOYDADA 
IMPLEMENT CO.

MASSEV-FEnGUSOIW

Floydada 983-3584

PRODUCER’S
COOPERATIVE

ELEVATOR
983-2821 - FLOYDADA 
983-3770 - DOUGHIJITY

________________  Farm Safely
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Before the need.. .You need your =  
Farm Bureau Insurance Agent =

k  =I
=  Clar Schacht 
5  Agency Manager

With your membership join in our campaign 
to elect Rick Perry as our 

new Ag Commissioner.

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE |
LOCKNEY - 652-2242 FLOYDADA - 983-3777 =  
101 SOUTH WALL, FLOYDADA, TEXAS, 79235 =

After three years, 
nothinE matches the

warranty.
notning m< 
MAGNUM

7140 MAGNUM Tractor

Five years or 5000 hours. That's 
the coverage you get—at no 
extra charge—on every new 
MAGNUM tractor. In fact, 
it's the same warranty* that 
covers every MAGNUM tractor 
ever built.

And, while the comp>etition 
offers an occasional free warranty, they 
haven't put it on every tractor. Besides, only 
MAGNUM'S 5-year/5000-hour warranty 
can be fully transferred without a fee. That 
gives the MAGNUM tractor's already* high 
resale value another boost. And it gives you 
another good reason to buy.

But what makes MAGNUM 
tractors even more attractive 
are the special buyer incentives 
we're offering this fall. Ask us 
about low-rate financing, waiver- 
of-financing or cash discounts 
in lieu of special financing. 
Offers too good to ignore.

See us today about an on-farm demon­
stration. Once you work a MAGNUM tractoi; 
you'll be convinced. Because no tractor 
beats a MAGNUM.

‘Excluding tires, which are covered by their own manufac- 
tureri warranties. A $200 deductible applies to each repair 
after the first year.

<1

Brown’s Implement
Box 718 Ralls Highway Floydada, Texas

983-2281

s  Kenneth Holt 
=  652-3456

f c u r  IRA's are paying 8 1/2^  S
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Continued from Page 1
ought to be retired from the bench forth­
with. Clinton is, and always has been, a 
liberal. He comes from the ACLU, un­
ion labor camp, and his decisions on the 
Court have consistently reflected that 
position. Clinton ought to be beaten 
badly, and Kitzman ought to be elected, 
in our view.

Also in the Republican column you 
will find the name of Louis Sturns, for 
the position of Place 2, Court of Crimi­
nal Appeals. He is a black jurist, with a 
reputation for fairness and intelligence. 
We believe he can be counted on to 
apply the law fairly and to avoid the 
“turn 'em loose” philosophy of Sam 
Houston Clinton, or that of his oppo­
nent, Morris Overstreet.

There are obviously a number of 
other judicial races, but those are the 
ones we would concentrate on.

On to other races. Obviously Phil 
Gramm is the pick for U.S. Senator. He 
is a heavyweight who has demonstrated 
he can get things done. His opponent, 
Hugh Parmer, is a lightweight who was 
merely looking for a way to keep his 
name alive, politically, until something 
else opened up. There’s no problem 
making a pick in this race.

The Governor’s race: Quite honestly 
we are somewhat underwhelmed with 
what we have to choose from here, but 
there are important differences that 
make it possible for us to make a choice, 
unlike the confused, “hands o ff’ ap­
proach exhibited by the Lubbock daily. 
The reason for this is that governors do 
not stand alone when they go into office. 
They take with them a vast number of 
people who share their sense of values. 
These are the people who staff the vari­
ous agencies and departments of gov­
ernment. They arc the people who are 
appointed to judicial vacancies when 
they occur. And to get some idea of who 
these people might be, and the attitude 
they would take into office with them, 
one must look to the track record, the 
background, of those who would make 
the appointments.

We have a good idea of the kind of 
people Ms. Richards would place in 
office to govern us, and quite frankly we 
don’t like what we see. It would be her 
friends and supporters from the past. 
They wou/d not have the values most 
Texans cherish, in our view.

For that reason, and for others, we

Political
Calendar
DISTRICT 84 HOUSE

OF REPRESENTATIVES
Warren Chisum

Political AdverlUIng Paid For by 
Jack Pcopicf, Trcaiurcr, Chisum Campaign 

2323 Evergreen, Pampa, Tx. 79M2

FLOYD COUNTY 
JUSTICE o r  THE PEACE 

Precincts 1 & 4

Lowell Bilbrey
PollUcal Ad. Pd. For by Lowell Bilbrey

RoseMary Segura
Polillcal Ad. Pd. For by RoseMary Segura

Precincts 2 & 3
Dottle Stansell
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C. L. (Mike) Mooney
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pick Clayton Williams for Governor 
over Ann Richards. And hope for the 
best

Somewhat the same reasons dictate 
our Dick in the race for Attorney Gen­
eral. We believe Dan Morales is proba­
bly the best person running for office, 
statewide, on the Democrat ticket He 
has generally exhibited a sound ap­
proach to government while serving in 
the Slate Legislature. But he owes so 
terribly much , in this campaign, to 
people like Jim Mattox that we fear he 
would not clean house in the Attorney 
General’s office, and a house cleaning is 
sorely needed.

Accordingly we would pick Buster 
Brown for the office. He too has been a 
good, solid State Senator, with a back­
ground as a prosecuting attorney. We 
believe he would clean house in the 
office. One would not go terribly wrong 
in voting for either, but for the reasons 
stated, we pick Brown.

The race for State Treasurer: Kay 
Baily Hutcheson against Nikki Van 
Hightower. No problem here. Mrs. 
Hutcheson is the obvious choice.

State Comptroller: Warren Harding 
and John Sharp. In our view two able 
men, but Sharp tried to convince us all 
that Mr. Dukakis should be President of 
the United States, even when he knew 
better. Our fear is that he would use the 
office for partisan purposes, and that 
office, of all offices, should not be used 
in that manner. We pick Harding, 
somewhat reluctantly.

Lt. Governor: This is a hard one, for 
us. Again, we have two able men seek­
ing the same spot, one the ultimate 
“insider”, and one the “outsider” who is 
not quite an outsider. Bob Bullock 
served in the Legislature before becom­
ing Comptroller and now seeks to be Lt. 
Governor. Rob Mosbacher is a young, 
energetic businessman who wants to 
serve in government, and whose family 
has the resources to help him in his 
quest. Bullock is a partisan Democrat 
who has some Republican support, 
based on his record in the Comptrollers 
office. Mosbacher is running as a Re­
publican who has some Democratic 
support, based, we presume, on his 
general approach to government. The 
importance of this race to West Texas, 
like the Governor’s race, is hard to 
overstate. In some respects it is an essen­
tially powerless office, but in others it is 
one of the most powerful in state gov­
ernment. Next year, in particular, it will 
have a tremendous influence in the re- 
disuicting process. There is no doubt 
that Bullock would use all the influence 
of his office to protect the enaenched 
Democratic establishment in state gov­
ernment. Some will see that as a good 
thing. Others will see it differently. It is 
for that reason, more than anything else, 
that we voted for Mosbacher. We are 
not prepared, however, to urge our read­
ers to follow our example in this in­
stance. Consider the issues, and how 
they affect you, and vote accordingly.

The race for U.S. Congress for the 
13th District: This is not difficult for us, 
but may be for many of our citizens. We 
have no quarrel with many of Mr. Sar- 
palius’ votes. He has cast some good 
ones and some bad ones, but our deci­
sion runs along different lines. Both 
Saipalius and Dick Waterfield, his op­
ponent in this race, served in the Legis­
lature in Austin, where Waterfield is 
still serving. We are aware of the service 
of both. Waterfield was, and is, regarded 
as a heavyweight among his peers. Sar- 
palius, on the other hand, was not so 
highly regarded, and is not now re­
garded as a heavyweight among his

peers in Congress. In our opinion that 
would be the case no matter how long 
Saipalius served in Congress. In our 
view Waterfield will move into a posi­
tion of influence among his peers much 
more quickly than Saipalius, and that 
would be better for this DistricL

Too, Waterfield would be in much 
better position to oppose the ridiculous 
goings-on in Congress than will Sar- 
palius. If people want to send a message, 
this is one place to start. We pick Water- 
lleld.

We understand that many of our citi­
zens, viewing the irresponsible delays 
and infighting in Congress, may decide 
to just stay home on election day. We 

' ' hope this will not be the case here in 
Floyd County. There are good people 
seeking office, some for the first time, 
and some who deserve reelection be­
cause they have worked diligently on 
the people’s behalf. The problem, of 
course, is telling the difference. We 
have tried here to relay our thoughts on 
the matter, as we see it. Others may not 
see it the way we do, but in any event we 
hope our readers vote their choice.

On a entirely different subject: The 
matter of our hospital.

As our readers are aware, and most 
certainly as we here at the paper are 
aware, we have had an outpouring of 
letters, pro and con, on the issue of the 
hospital. We feel we have been more 
than generous in the space we have 
devoted to the subject, and we have done 
so for several reasons.

First, we thought that it was and is an 
important subject on which legitimate 
differences of opinion exist, and those 
opinions deserved a thorough ventila­
tion. Too, we are somewhat proud that 
local citizens look upon our (their) 
paper as a place where they can have 
some input into comn>unity affairs. We 
have tried to oblige, at considerable 
expense to the paper. For that we have 
no regrets.

We do have a few regrets that some 
aspects of the community debate has 
taken on a tone we would not have 
preferred. While we can understand the 
(at times) emotional nature of the de­
bate, we should all be able to disagree 
without being disagreeable.

We have, on numerous occasions, 
had to edit some of the letters coming 
into this office dealing with the subject. 
This has occurred on both sides. We 
hope partisans on both sides understand.

At any rate we feel that just about 
everything that could be said, has been 
said. Acc(xdingly, we will announce 
now that we will run no letters on this 
particular subject on the week preceding 
the vote on November 20. This will 
prevent charges being made in letters to 
the editor that cannot be answered be­
fore the vote. And in the edition preced­
ing the vote we will indicate our own 
thinking on the matter.

Where’s The Fire?
By Paul McIntosh

Fire personnel answered a call at Scott 
Gin at 11:50 a.m. on Sunday, October 
28. Eleven firemen responded. Two 
cotton modules were on fire.

A fire on the highway right of way, 
Tuesday, October 30, was answered at 
2:45 p.m. The fire was two miles south 
on Hwy. 62. Nine firemen responded to 
the blaze caused by grass and cotton in a 
bar ditch.

Everyone is asked to use ashtrays in 
order to avoid this type of fire. Cotton 
lint and dry grass are easily ignited by 
carelessly tossed cigarettes.

DQCOUNTOY

TACOS!
3/*1^9

TACO SALAD!$2 AQ Cheese
NACHOS! 

9 9 '

Not all products available in all stores. 
Good only at participating Dairy Queeit stores.

« R«g. US. Pat. S Tm. Ofl. Am D.Q Cofp

THIS IS

<$)►
COUNTRY

Prices Good
OCTOBER 29 thru NOVEMBER 18,1990

•ma Rag. US. Pal. a Tm. Th. O.O. Op. Coun. e IX. D.O. Op Coorv

HOLIDAY HAPPENINGS-Some of this year's models 
for the Women's Chamber Holdiay Happenings as­
sembled on the courthouse lawn to check out Christmas

lights and get their picture taken. This year's style show 
will be held Nov. 5, at 7:00 p.m., at Duncan.

Staff Photo

Winter Wonderland is theme of 4th annual 
Holiday Happening style show and supper

The Women’s Chamber of Com­
merce 4th annual Holiday Happenings 
Style Show and Salad Supper will be 
held Monday, November 5. This year’s 
event will be held at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Duncan cafeteria. Admission will be 
$2.00 plus a salad. Half of the proceeds 
will go towards a scholarship for the 
newly crowned Miss Floydada, Satur­
day, Nov. 17.

A “Winter Wonderland” will be the 
theme for this year’s style show.

The job of emcee will be shared this 
year by Anne Carthel and Julianne 
Cornelius. Entertainment will be pro­
vided by Proelaim.

Not only will you get a chance to taste 
a variety of delicious homemade salads, 
but “goodie bags” will be given to ev­
eryone in attendance. You will also have 
a good chance to win a door prize from 
approximately 30 prizes provided by 
area merchants.

The fall fashions will not be the only 
thing worth looking to buy. Nineteen 
businesses and artistic individuals will 
be displaying their aits and crafts for 
Christmas ideas inside the cafeteria.

You can browse through and pur­
chase at the tables decorated by Three 
Amish Friends, Sue’s Gifts, Williams

Florist, Davis & Sons Builders Mart, 
Simpson Trees, Jan Rubio, Deedie 
Covington, Vickie Norrell, Floyd 
County 4-H, Kay Rainwater, Nancy 
Hagood, Susan Simpson, Vivians Ce­
ramics, Sunbelt Savings, Dianna 
Owens, Stacey Smith, Duncan Elemen­
tary, Peggy Probasco, Brenda Heflin 
and Nancy Graham.

Businesses supplying the styles for 
the models will be: Jodi’s, Hale’s, Kids 
Kloset, Scars and Perrys.

Modeling for Jodi’s will be Deanna 
Watson, Janice Richburg, Janet Himes 
and Amanda Fulton.

Nettie Ruth Whittle, Deedie Coving­
ton, Vickie Norrell, Belle Vinson, Lori 
Gilly, Missy Pcmcll, Reagan Pcmcll, 
Molly Long, and Ashley Norrell will be

modeling for Hale’s.
Kids Kloscl’s models will be Jason 

Nutt, Meghan Graham and Marla 
Reeves.

Models for Sears will be Whitney 
Williams, Lind.sey Nutt, Betsey Smith, 
Katie Smith, Robin Galloway, Teresa 
Bums, Debbie Hariline, Jeremy Rubio, 
and Scott Crader. Scars will also be 
providing the dresses for Anne Carthel 
and Julianne Cornelius as well as for 
Randi Duke, “Little Miss”, and Lindsey 
Whitten, “Tiny Miss.”

Models for Perrys include Samantha 
Salazar and Rosalinda Gonzalez.

Models arc reminded of rehearsal 
Sunday, Nov. 4, at 2:00 in the Duncan 
Cafeteria.

THE RIGHT CHOICE FOR TEXAS

CHARLES F. (CHARLIE)

BAIRD
m

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS
Paid Pol Adv byChadesP ;Cb.i''ie) Qa'fd Campaign. Mark Vo a. Trvas 
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TO THE VOTERS OF THE CAPROCK HOSPITAL DISTRICT:
On November 20th voters will go to the Massie Activity Center to vote in the hospital rollback election. We need to stop 

the waste and mismanagement that has taken place for the last several years by voting for the rollback.
Some of the acts of mismanagement and impropriety are as follows:
1. FailurcoflheCaprock Hospital Board to require the hospital administrator to file the annual sworn financial statemens 

which are required by law. The law requires these statements to be prepared and signed under oath and presented to the 
hospital board so they can study them and know how the taxpayers money is spent.

2. Failure of the board to require the administrator to collect accounts receivable, keep the billing straight and accurate, 
file insurance claims correctly and timely, cut the number of office employees and other employees down to a reasonable 
level. Considering that the annual average of in-patients is only 3 per day.

3. Stop entering into ridiculous conu-acts such as the one entered into with Dr. Chamalcs (a dermatologist of all things!) 
whereby the hospital contracted to guarantee his salary to be $240,000 over a 2 year period, paid his moving expenses from 
the state of Oregon, paid his house rent of $800 per month on a house that courthouse records show was owned by Fred 
Thayer, a member of the board.

4. Failure to make use of the vacant space in the hospital by utilizing it as a nursing home.
5. Failure to terminate the contract with Methodist Hospital. This obligates the district to pay $20 per hour consulting 

fees to Methodist Hospital when they have not had a representative at all the board meetings as the contract requires.
6. Failure to sell the residence owned by the district The district does not need to own this house and rent it to Dr. Lopez 

for 1/2 its rental value.
7. Failure to charge the Drs. using the clinic enough rent to cover the utility bills, maintenance and repair bills and other 

expenses. The $250 per month just won’t begin to cover these expenses.
8. Failure to prosecute the claim against Caprock Hospital Medical Services and Dan Powers, former lessee of Caprock 

hospital. This claim was filed in the district court by the former Caprock Hospital Board. Total amount of the claim was 
$565,000. This was broken down as follows: A. Advances made to lessee $172,351; B. Pharmacy inventory carried away 
by the lessees $43,923; C. Reimbursement of insurance paid by the hospital district $26,916; D. Note owed to the First 
National Bank of Floydada which the Powers failed to pay, which the bank withdrew from the hospital account $90,000;
E. Overdraft owed by the Powers that was not paid to the FNB of Floydada withdrew from the hospital account $41,854;
F. Advance payments made by payments to Powers which was not paid over to the hospital $27,000
G. Advance made to the Powers by the hospital district $170,000.

Total claim of Caprock Hospital against the Powers and Caprock Medical Service Inc. $564,494.
Present Caprock board failed to prosecute this claim with the result that $564,000 of the taxpayers money went down the 

drain.
The FNB of Floydada claimed to have the authority to withdraw the above mentioned amounts for notes and overdrafts 

made by the Powers pursuant to a “continuing guarantee” signed by Edmund Aldine Williams, who was president of the 
Caprock Hospital Board at that time. The other Caprock board members at that lime were Claude Weathersbee, Louis 
Anderson, Don Bean, and Jo Wester. This “continuing guarantee” was made even tho the Texas Constitution and Statutes 
prohibit the state and political subdivisions of the state from lending its credit to any private person or corporation.

The board should not be threatening the people with closing the hospital. They cannot dissolve the district until they call 
an election and the people vole to dissolve the district. They don’t have the legal authority to dissolve the hospital district 
and the people will not tolerate that. If they attempt to close the hospital, we can get them out of office and get some people 
who will continue to run it.

While the administrator is promoting a 70% tax increase, he is inquiring about other jobs. He can walk away and leave 
us this enormous lax burden. If the administrator is not willing to straighten up his act, comply with the law, keep his billing 
straight, file the insurance claims on time, cut the staff down to what is actually needed, and cut other expenses that need 
to be cut; then many of us are hopeful that he can find himself another job.

This town is Totally Dependant on Agri-Business. The Farmers and Ranchers, who will Pay The Brunt of This Tax, Are 
Not Compelled To Sell Their Catde, Colton, or Grain Here. Nor Is There Any Reason We Should Assume That They Will 
Continue to Support This Community, Buying Our Goods, If We Continue To Levy Heavier and Heavier Taxes On Them 
Each Year. The Landowners Can Take Their Money From The Banks and Transact Their Business Elsewhere If Taxing 
Entities Do Not Show Some Real Restraint, Very Rapidly.

The whole future of Floydada depends upon maintaining the good will of the people of the rural areas of this county. This 
is of vital importance if Floydada is to have any future at all.

One reason the hospital doesn’t have any more patients the doctors charge about twice as much as the doctors in Lockney. 
The board members don’t have any control over this but they do have control over their rent on the clinic. The Uxpayers 
arc not supposed to subsidize; individuals and that’s what we’re doing on the house rent and clinic.

IT IS TIME FOR ALL VOTERS OF THE DISTRICT TO JOIN TOGETHER TO STOP THIS USELESS, 
NEEDLESS AND IRRESPONSIBLE WASTE AND THERE IS JUST ONE WAY TO DO THIS - TO LIMIT THE 
AMOUNT OF TAXES BY VOTING “FOR” THE ROLLBACK ON NOVEMBER 20TH AT THE MASSIE

Paid For By Floyd County Taxpayers Association, Vicki Webster, Treasurer__________________
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Obituaries Dedication ceremony slated for bank
LINNIE ABBOTT
Funeral services for Frances Linnie 

Abbou, 72. will be al 10 a.m. Thursday, 
November 1, 1990, in First Baptist 
Church with the Rev. John Jenkins, re­
tired pastor of the First Baptist Church, 
assisted by Rev. Garry Higgs, pastor, 
officiating.

Burial will be in Roydada Memorial 
Park by Moore-Rose-Whitc Funeral 
Home.

Mrs. Abbott died at 2 a.m. Tuesday, 
October 30,1990, in Lockney General 
Hospital after an illness. *

She was bom Frances Linnie Fletcher 
on October 19, 1918, in Sanger. She 
attended schools in Denton, graduating 
in 1935. She graduated from Texas 
Women’s University in 1940 and taught 
economics in Lometa, Blackwell and 
Big Lake. She married Noble Silas 
Abbott in May 1945 in Denton. He died 
in August 1980.

She lived in Muleshoe, Slade and 
Lubbock before moving to Floydada in 
1948. She moved to a farm near Lock­
ney in 1952.

She was a homemaker and taught 
school at Lockney Junior High School 
for eight years and in the elementary 
grades for 14 years, retiring in 1984. She 
was a member of First Baptist Church of 
Lockney, and the TEL Sunday School 
Class, Women’s Missionary Union, El 
Progresso Study Club, Lockney Craft 
Club, AARP, Lockney Senior Citizens 
and Texas Retired Teachers Associa­
tion.

Survivors include one daughter, 
Linda Cranfill of Midland; three sons, 
Stanley of Santa Fe, N.M., Barton of 
Washington, D.C., and Larry of McKin­
ney; one sister, Mrs. C.M. (Flora) Wil­
liams of Spokane, Wash.; five brothers, 
T.J. Fletcher and Richard Fletcher, both 
of Denton, Bob Fletcher of Fort Worth, 
Alvin Fletcher of Alvin and John 
Fletcher of Colorado Springs, Colo.; 
and six grandchildren.

When Words 
Are Not Enough

Show them  you are  
th inking  of them  by 

sending flowers. 
Flow ers silently express 

your sym pathy and  
provide an  im m ediate way 

to let your fam ily know  tha t 
you really care.

WILUAMS FLORIST
to SHOT

128 W. California 983-5013

Pallbearers will be Kenneth Holt. 
Gary Marr. Kelton Shaw, Richard 
Wiley. Bryan Karr and Jim Martin.

Honorary pallbearers are Leslie 
Ferguson and Hubert Frizzell.

DOROTHY LANGLEY
Funeral services for Dorothy (Ander­

son) Langley were held at 2 p.m. Friday, 
OcL 26, at St. Johns Catholic Church in 
Ennis, Texas. Interment was in Ennis 
Cemetery by the side of her husband, 
Roy Langley, who preceded her in death 
in 1984.

She died Thursday, Oct. 25,1990, at 
the home of her daughter, where she had 
resided for the last three years after 
having suffered a severe heart attack and 
stroke.

Mrs. Langley was bom Aug. 27,1907 
in Arkansas.. She moved to Floyd 
County in 1%0 with her parents and 
family from Oklahoma. They lived in 
the Liberty Community and attended 
school there.

She married Roy P. Langley in 1925, 
who lived in Ennis, Texas, and they 
made their home there. She was a home­
maker and also worked for Ennis Busi­
ness Forms Co. for 43 years.

She was also preceded in death by her 
parents, William W. and Bessie Ander­
son, two brothers and one sister.

Survivors include her daughter, Jua­
nita LeVay; three grandchildren; four 
great-grandchildren; one brother, J.C. 
Anderson of Amarillo; three sisters, 
Beulah Baker of Floydada, Evelyn 
Leatherman of Weatherford and Dollie 
Burgett of Proctor Lake area.

MARY LEOLA LEMONS
Services for Mary Leola Lemons, 79, 

of Lubbock were at 10:00 a.m. Monday, 
OcL 29, at Sanders Memorial Chapel 
with the Rev. Mel Hooten, Pastorial 
Counselor-Hospice of Lubbock, offici­
ating.

Burial was at 12:(X) p.m. Monday at 
Roydada Memorial Park under the di­
rection of Sanders Funeral Home.

She died at 4:00 a.m. Friday, OcL 26, 
1990, at her son’s residence after a 
lengthy illness.

She was bom on June 18, 1911 in

HEALTH
INSURANCE

Affordable Rates 
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Cancer Policy

David Cates
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Enterprise, Oklahoma. She married 
Ralph Lemons in SepL 1929 in Clovis, 
N.M. He preceded her in death in Octo­
ber, 1986. She resided in Silverton until 
1949 moving to Roydada. She moved to 
Lubbock in 1988.

Survivors include her son, Duane 
Lemons of Lubbock; three brothers, 
George Pharr of Lubbock, Leon Riarr of 
Kingsland, Texas, and J.B. Pharr of 
Oakland, Oklahoma; three sisters, 
Marie Sanders of Lubbock, Wilma 
Turner of Bochita, Oklahoma, and 
Grace Schell of Lackeport, Calif.; one 
grandson, Douglas Lemons of Los 
Angeles, Calif.; and one granddaughter, 
Mary Lemons of Santa Clara, Calif.

LENA WADE
JENNINGS PHILLIPS
Services for Lena Wade Jennings 

Phillips, 73, of Canyon were at 10 a.m. 
Thursday, Oct. 25, in First Christian 
Church with tlie Rev. Paul Land, pastor, 
officiating.

Burial was at 2 p.m. in Plainview 
Memorial Park under direction of 
Schooler-Gordon Funeral Directors of 
Canyon.

Mrs. Phillips died in a car accident 
Monday morning, OcL 22,1990.

She was bom in Canyon and gradu­
ated from West Texas State University 
in 1938. She married George Martin 
Phillips II May 19,1940, in Amarillo; he 
died in 1967. She was a former school­
teacher and a homemaker. She lived in 
the Valley View community in Hale 
County for more than 30 years.

She was a life member of the Pan­
handle Plains Historical Museum, a 
member of the American Association of 
University Women, and a member of 
the First Christian Church of Canyon, 
where she served as deaconess and 
church treasurer. A daughter, Donna 
Susan, died in 1962.

Survivors include a son, George III of 
Baytown; two sisters, Kathleen Hagood 
of Roydada and Ruth Hill of Spearman; 
a brother. Jack Neil Jennings of Canyon; 
and a granddaughter.

Pallbearers were Mike Phillips, Pat 
Phillips, Cleve Rousser, Rick Rousser, 
Ellison Williams and Lester North.

The family suggests memorials to the 
First Christian Church of Canyon.

W RITE-IN

C.L. (Mike) Mooney
»

fo r  Justice o f the Peace 
Precincts 2 & 3

*  Qualified
* Experienced
* Dependable
* Fair and Impartial

Write Mike in on the ballot 
on November 6

Continued From Page 1
Following the passage of the Federal 

Reserve Act by Congress, the bank en­
tered the Federal Reserve System in 
January, 1914, buying stock in the Dal­
las Federal Reserve Bank.

In 1918 an addition of 50 feet wesL 
facing California StreeL was made to 
the bank building. In this addition were 
located three businesses: the Roydada 
Post Office, Wamie Hilton’s Barber 
Shop, and Jones and Howard Meat 
MaikeL Above the bank, on the second 
floor, were the offices of professional 
men.

By 1928, the 25th anniversary of the 
bank was celebrated in a new remodeled 
and refurnished banking room. The 
public was invited the formal opening 
and view the black and white tile floor, 
the teller cages of marble and plate glass 
with sandblaster edges, finished with 
bronze wrought iron. A Tennessee 
marble check stand testified to the in­
creased use of checks and number of 
depositors. Deposits now totaled 
$665,691.41, denoting a period of ex­
pansion in the plains area.

The First National Bank weathered 
the depression years, along with Royd 
County citizens. Deposits were few and 
far between. Roydada script money was 
issued, redeemable at the bank “after 36 
three-cent trade stamps were affixed.” 
The stockholders and directors bor­
rowed of their own resources and con­
tributed a fund of $25,000.00 to provide 
for bank losses.

After the bank moratorium and the 
organization of the Federal Deposit 
Insurance Corporation, the institution 
became a member of this group. At that 
time, deposits up to $5,000,000 were 
insured by FDIC.

Deposits increased after the depres­
sion years, and in 1941 were 
$992,371.33. In March, 1949, the capi­
tal stock was increased to $100,000.00.

After serving in the U.S. Air Force, 
Thomas Kinder Farris returned to 
Roydada to establish his home and 
continued the interest in the bank that 
had played a great role in the lives ofhis 
mother and father, John N. and Lora 
Rucker Farris. He was named director in 
1948.

In 1959, the bank was expanded and 
remodeled. An additional 25 feet were

added to the north, the top story was 
removed, and Roydada’s first drive-in 
window was opened off California 
Suw L

The interior addition included a com­
munity room to be used by the towns­
people.

The bank had to be moved to the old 
Clements Building from April-Novem- 
ber, 1959, when a sudden 2 inch rain­
storm broke through the temporary 
construction shelter, soaking every­
thing and everybody in the bank. The 
new quarters on the same comer of the 
square were opened November 22,
1959.

Deposits were increasing, and by
1960, they were $8,089,899.26. Kinder 
Farris was named chairman of the board 
in 1960, a position he still holds today.

Thomas Kinder Farris Jr. joined the 
bank force in July, 1973, making the 
third generation to continue the interest 
that had begun with his grandfather, 
John, in 1903. Tom is now a director and 
has been the bank’s president since 
January 1,1978.

In June, 1983, Thomas Montgomery 
(Monte) Williams joined the bank, cur­
rently a vice president and senior loan 
officer. He was also elected to the board 
of directors in January, 1989.

This year, September 30,1990, the

Floyd County 
Grand Jury 
indicts nine

Continued From Page 1 
Brown was also sentenced to one year in 
jail which was probated for two years;

Fernando Gonzales, 20, of South 
Plains, pled guilty to DWI. He was fined 
$500.00 plus court costs and sentenced 
to one year in jail, which was probated 
for two years;

Reginaldo Mata, 22, of Dougherty, 
pled guilty on OcL 25, to his Oct. 23 
charge of DWI. He was fined $500.00 
plus court costs and sentenced to 180 
days in jail which was probated for two 
years.

In J.P. court, for the weeks OcL 2 - 
OcL 30, there were 1% misdemeanor 
cases filed.

one-hundredth year of banking for the 
First National Bank, the deposits are 
48,678,000.00, and the directors are: 
Kinder Farris,, Tom Farris,, George R. 
Farris, C J. Payne, Kellon Shaw, T.M. 
(Monte) Williams, and Fred Zimmer­
man III.

Officers of the bank are: Kinder Far­
ris, chairman; Tom Farris, president; 
C J. Payne, senior vice-president and 
cashier, Monte Williams, vice president 
and senior loan officer; Glenda F. 
Wilson, assistant vice president; Nell 
Swinson, assistant cashier and Reta 
Pierce, assistant cashier.

Employees of the bank include: 
Nancy Welbom, Dixie Smith, Joy 
Smitherman, Beth Eckert, Vickie Cates, 
Darlenda Marquis, Martha Lotspeich, 
Pat Graham, Willie Marricle, Judy 
Emert, Debbie Amey and Don Payne.

Sales tax rebates 
on upswing for 
city of Floydada

The City of Roydada continues to 
show an increase in monthly sales tax 
rebate receipts over figures. The check 
received in October was in the amount 
of $8,879.15 showed an increase of 
12.14% over the $7,917.69 payment 
received in October of 1989. Payments 
to date in 1990 received by Roydada 
total $92,038.06, a decrease over all of
0.90% from the $92,877.33 received at 
this time in 1989.

Lockney received a check for 
$4,747.48 this month. This represents a 
decrease of 35.84% from the October 
payment of $7,399.80 received in 1989. 
Over all, Lockney payments have fallen 
from $58,520.91 at this time in 1989 to 
$40,775.48 received to date in 1990. 
This is a decrease of 30.32%.

All local sales taxes have been ap­
proved by local voters and may be used 
for any legal city or county expense.

A Gift to theAMERI^N^MCER^Xim

MEMORIAL
PROGRAM 

goes a long way 
in cancer control.

Political Ad Paid for by C.L. (Mike) Mooney

How many teachers 
does it take to chan^  
the future of Texa^

One.
Ann Richards.

\ h
Ann Richards and her granddaughter, Lily Adams.

Ann Richards has taught public school. She has a plan to improve 
education, increase respect for teachers, and to involve parents in 
local control of our schools.

Clayton Williams’ education plan is to use taxpayer’s money to 
pay the tuition for children who attend private school.

Ann Richards will stand and deliver for the public school children 
and educators in Texas.

Ann Richards. Hope for a New Texas,
AnnRidiards
G O V E  R N O R

Political Ad Paid for by Friends of Ann Richards, Lynn M arler, Treasurer
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CLRSSi r i ED RDUERTI SI N6
AUTOMOTIVE

’ROT-BIRD, $2350; ’81 Bonneville, $1950; 
’79 Buick, 4 door, $ 1850; ’ 81 Dodge Sution 
Wagon, $1250; ’81 Pontiac, 4 door, $1250. 
W. B. Eakin Car Lot, Ralls Highway, 983- 
3616.

11-lc

1981 FOUR DOOR CHEVROLET. 983- 
3833.

11-lp

FOR SALE: 1985 CMC 1/2 ton pickup 
truck. 70,000 miles, has bed liner, air condi- 
tioirer, AM-FM cassette player, power steer­
ing, power brakes, heavy duty transmission 
and radiator. $5,500. Call 983-3737 during 
day, 652-2552 at night.

tfnc

FARMS FOR SALE

133 ACRES IRRIGATED FARM luid
with 8 inch irrigation well with pump and 
motor, for sale, $60,000.10 acres land with 
brick 2 bedroom 1 bath house, domestic 
pump, 4 inch electric irrigation pump with 
motor, 104' x 40’ steel bam on highway 4 
miles east of Silverton. $38,000. This prop­
erty can be sold together or seperate. Other 
good irrigated farms in Floyd, Hale, 
Swisher, Briscoe and Lamb Countys. Call 
Wade Clark & Associates. 296-7058 or 
Ralph Miller. 296-2994.

11-lc

GARAGE SALES

LOCKNEY

GARAGE SALE: 514 SW 4TH, Lockney. 
8-6, Saturday; 9-5, Simday. 750 Honda, 125 
Y am aha, dishwasher, barbecue grill, antique 
kitchen table, miscellaneous.

11-lc

158 ACRE IRRIGATED FARM on pave­
ment 2 miles north of Aiken. Work, 915- 
566-2936; evenings, 915-592-3310.

12-20C

LARGE GARAGE SALE (Saturday & 
Sunday, Nov. 3 & 4). 4 family. Yamaha 80 
dirt bike; '85 Toronado, loaded; 4 speed GM 
transmission; loading ramps; tool boxes; 
exercise rowing machine; clothes & house­
hold items; things for most everybody. Don’t 
miss this one. South side of Highway70 at 
Aiken, old service station area.

11-lp

OTHER

CARD OF THANKS

Thanks so much to all who helped make 
our 70th Armiversary so nice with the gifts, 
flowers, cards and telephone calls. A big 
Thanks to those that came to our party. God 
bless you all.

The Jess Glover Family 
11-lp

FOR RENT

FOR RENT: One bedroom apartment. 983- 
5320.

11-lp

r

CHRISTMAS SHOP EARLY.Collectible 
Eggee Lorrie dolls and others. Cabbage 
Patch Twins. Little clothes replaced each 
week. Wood crafts. The oldest but goodest 
crochet and embroidery. Traders Villlage, 
Plainview. 296-9483.

11-lc

GARAGE SALES

To all those that expressed their concern, 
we want to say Thank You. Especially to Dr. 
Hale and the nurses atCaprock Hospital and 
those who staff and drive the ambulance. For 
all who visited us, for the cards atKl calls at 
the hospital and at home, we are thankful for 
such wonderful friends and neighbors. May 
God bless each of you.

Harlie and Valrie Vick 
11-lp

FLOYDADA

GARAGE SALE: 917 SOUTH W all.. 
Thursday and Friday, November 1 aixl 2.

11-lp

GARAGE SALE: 128 W. MARIVENA. 
Thursday, 2-6. Baby Crib, twin beds, dish­
washer.

11-lp

FARM SERVICES

WE CUSTOM MAKE AND n T  
Air conditioning hoses for 

all types of machines. 
BROWN IMPLEMENT 

983-2281

INDOOR TRAILER SALE: Friday, No­
vember 2, all day. 415 W. Virginia. Clothes 
and etc.

11-lp

GARAGE SALE: FRIDAY & Saturday, 
9:00 till? 900 S. Main.

11-lp
tfc

Copies o f  the 
Floyd County Centennia l 
Issue  are on sale at the  
F lo yd  County  Hesperian  

The 220 page Issue  
Is  p r ic e d  a t $2.00.

GARAGE SALE- 512 WEST Kentucky 
Friday only from 4-6 p.m. Boy’s clothes, 
boy’s bicycle, wok, cookware, night stand 
chairs, ladies clothes.

11-lp

TRY
BUYING IT 
HERE FIRST!

PUBLIC NOTICES

Notice of Meeting
A regular meeting of the Board of Directors for Floyd County Central Appraisal 
District will be held on Monday, November 5,1990 at 9:00 A.M. in the Appraisal 
Office Board Room, Room 107, County Courthouse.

11-lc

Notice to Bidders
Mackenzie Municipal Water Authority will accept bids for a used 6300 

AT&T, 30 MB Computer, along with a Panasonic KX-Pl 180 Printer,

Computer and printer may be seen at the main office on the south side of the 
lake. Bids will be opened on November 20,1990.

Mackenzie Municipal Water Authority 
Rt. 1 Box 14 
Silverton, TX 79257 
(806)633-4318

ll-8c

Webb’s Lock & Key
■Unlocks Cars' Saw Sharpening
K eys M ade j ; a | l  9 8 3 - 3 2 2 9  ’**'‘*5'

NOW HIRING
R. N. Director of Nursing

LVN's Needed.
$500 sign on bonus for LVN's 

11 to 7 shift premium paid to LVN's

Certified Nurses Aides Needed

Nurses Aide Certification Training 
Program Provided on the Job 

Trainees Needed

Contact Ruby Bailey at the Lockney. Care Center 
401 N. Main, Lockney, 652-3375

HELP WANTED

FARM HAND NEEDED. 697-2631.
tfc

FLOYDADA NURSING HOME IS look­
ing for an RN to fill the position as Director 
of Nursing, (^alified applicant must hold a 
current Texas License. Salary and benefits 
will be discussed at the time applicant ap­
plies. No phone calls please. Apply at 925 
West Crockett StreeL Floydada. Ask for 
Cheryl W ard, ADM. or Laura T ay lor D.O.N.

tfc

NOW TAKING APPLICATIONS for 
RN’s and LVN’s. A great place to work. 
Salary negotiable. Contact Lavona Pilch- 
ford, Ralls Nursing Home. 253-2314, Ralls, 
Texas.

11-lc

"When business is good 
it pays to advertise;

When business K bad 
you’ve got to advertise.’’

STORAGE SPACE
West Texas Mini Storage

c/o Assiter Insurance 
206 W. California 

983-2511

Script Printing 
& Office Supply 

• Commercial Printing 
• Office Supplies & Furniture 

•Business Machines
108 S. Main Floydada 983-5131

HOUSES FOR SALE

HOME FOR SALE - 3 bedroom (isolated 
master bedroom), 2 bath, fireplace, double 
garage & central heat. Just repainted inside. 
Nice location in quiet neighborhood! Call 
983-2740.

tfc

IRRIGATION

IRRIGATION PRODUCTS INC, 
Valley Irrigation Systems 

4521 Clovis Road 
Lubbock 765-5490 

QUALITY - DEPENDABILITY
tfc

3 BEDROOM, BRICK HOUSE, 2 baths, 
central heat and air conditioning, den, fire­
place, 1 car garage, cellar. Good Location. 
Close to all schools. Reduced!! Call 652- 
2544 or 652-3504.

Il-I5c

3 BEDROOM BRICK, RREPLACE, 
covered patio, near school. Call 983-5761 or 
983-2439.

tfc

MISCELLANEOUS

FOR SALE; KING SIZE waterbed with 
etched mirror, bookcase headboard, padded 
side rails, mattress and heater. Call 983- 
2470, Monday-Friday after 7 p.m. and week­
ends.

tfc

FOR SALE -SWEET POTATOES- Lo­
cated 6 miles north of Flomot or 4 1/2 miles 
south of Valley School. Joe Edd Helms.

11-8c
HOUSE WITH 5 LOTS: 401 E. Locust, 
Lockney. 2-1-1, brick. 214-255-0604 or 
806-296-2464.

tfc

ROUND BALES OF HAYGRAZER. 
Laimy Glasscock, 405-332-3617.

12-13C

NEAT 2 BEDROOM HOUSE on coiner 
lot near school. Fenced back yard and stor­
age. Perfect for couple. Call 983-5084 or 
983-2722.

tfc

BROCCOLI LOCALLY GROWN near 
Ralls. Fresh cut. Call 806-253-3(X)3 after 
5:00.

11-lc

HOUSE FOR SALE: THREE bedroom. 
319 W. Missouri. 983-3306.

tfc

3//2Z2, ISOLATED MASTER, DRAPED, 
fireplace, fans, sprinkler system, land­
scaped. Must see to appreciate. Call Ray 
Reed. 983-3998.

ll-22p

CARPORTS - PATIO COVERS. Free 
Estimates, l-8(X)-762-3699.

tfc

Don^t drink and 
drive!

BOND LANDS, INC REAL ESTATE
107 S. 5th Street P. O. Box 487

806-983-2151 Floydada, Texas 79235-0487
Dale Goen, Broker Frances Ashton, Office Manager

General Land Services, Sales, Leases, and Management

Cl.ASSIITED RATE
The Hesperian.........983-3737
rile  beaeon............... 652-33IS
l irsl Insertion..... 20 cents per word

Minimum Chnrge.......... S2.50
.Sectnid Insertion...I5 cents per word

Minimum Charge.......... SL50
( 'ard ttf Thanks..........................S3.00

C LASSIFIED  ADS PAY!

We have new listings of 2 and 3 bedroom homes 
in most areas of town.

We also have several nice homes in the country.
FOR ALL YOUR REAL ESTATE NEEDS, CALL 

SAM HALE REAL ESTATE 
983-3261

C R H
Systems

118 Wcst Califomil 
983-2445 983-3151
Computers & Stuff 
Visit Our Show room 
Everyday Low Pricer,

Have a good week!
I LAND LEVELING TERRACES ! 
I PUMP PITS BENCHING

FRED PARSON 
983-2646 293-4768

POOLE
MUFFLER & RADIATOR 

Sales and Installation  
Free pickup & delivery 

407 E. Houston  
983-2285

Need A Home 
A ppliance R epaired?

Call
DON PAYNE 
(806) 983-2939

MISCELLANEOUS

ROTO TILLER. KITCHEN-AID pon- 
able dishwasher, two black wrought iron 
seven plant stands, wooden two seat swing, 
one barbeque picnic table and benchs, one 
La-Z-Boy rocker/rccliner-gold. 983-5273.

11-lp

HAND PAINTED AND DECORATED 
sweatshirts, T-shiru, skirts, tennis shoes, 
etc. For your holiday gift giving or wearing. 
Your design or mine. Beth BramleL 652- 
2322

ll-22p

POOLE
W ELL SERVICE

Sales & Service 
on all types 

submersible pumps 
407 E. Houston 983-2285

ADAMS
WELL SERVICE

Complete irrigation service 
5 year warranty, domestic pump

720 N. 2nd 
983-5003

• • • • • • • • • • • a a a a a a a

TWO LOVE COUCHES for sale. 983- 
3255.

11-8C

USED ELECTRIC COOKSTOVE for 
sale. $100.00. Call 983-2475 or 983-3635 
after 5:00 pjn.

11-lc

ANTIQUE FRAZIER SADDLE, McClel­
lan cavalry saddle, saddle bags, spurs. 1- 
296-9419.

11-lp

FOR SALE: ONE MAPLE end table, and 
one table built in lamp; green drapes to fit 10 
ft. and 4 fL window. Call 983-2084.

11-lp

PERSONALS

REDUCE: BURN OFF PAT while you 
sleep. Take OPAL tablets and E-VAP diu­
retic. Thompson Pharmacy.

11-8p

SERVICES

CARPET STEAM CLEANED, affordable 
rates. 10% discount to first caller in your city. 
For information call Dcrinda Patton. 847- 
2625.

11-lc

TREE & YARD SPRAYING —  Emerl’s 
Nursery & Tree Service. 652-3116 after 6.

tfc

APPLIANCE SERVICE REPAIR: All 
kinds of household appliances. Call Gene 
Lowrance. 983-2763.

tfc

V.
WANTED

FARMLAND WANTED to buy, rent or 
cash lease. Dryland preferred in Lockney, 
Stcricy, South Plains, Cedar Hill or Muncy 
area. Contact Larry BramleL 806-652-2322 
or Wayne BramleL 806-652-3441.

ll-22p

ALTERNATOR & STARTER 
REPAIRS

Norrell Tractor Parts 
215 S. Main 983-3417

W AYNE’S W ELDING
For All Your Welding Needs 

Portable & Shop
509 N. 2nd. 983-3908

ECONOMICAL STORAGE 
TRY BARKER'S

Jewel Box-Mini Storage|
and save your tima and money. 

P h o n e  6 5 2 -2 6 4 2  
Corner Main & L o cu st  

L ock n ey , T exas  
BARKER BUILDING

■̂i’DavId McGowen Construction:^
.♦.V

Torracea - Waterways 
Water Pits - Washes

/ --------------------------------------->
Brighten your home for the

Holiday Season. Call
"A Creative Touch" 

for a free estimate on painting 
and wallpaper installation. 

Specializing in creative custom 
finishes such as marblizing, 

sponge painting, stenciling, etc.
983-5320 or 983-2318.

Quality Work -  Reasonable Prices"

983-3031

Probasco
Flying Service

Orrkc at Floydada Municipal Airport
983-2314 or 983-5061

AERIAL PESTICIDE APPLICA’nON
N ights Call: Mitch Probasco - 983-23681 or Timmy Cervantes - 983-5531

Sprockets 
Chain 
V Belts 
Sheave

Diamond Industrial Supply Co., Inc.
PfSone Days 296-7418 U Joints

Nights 296-1200 or 296-7828 Oil Seals
1014 B roadw ay, P la in v ie w , Texas ORings 

SFC BCA Timken Bower Wisconsin
We Appreciate Your Business More”

FURNITURE RESTORATION
Are you thinking of buying new furniture?

V\nu It upset your budget?
It wont It you consider having It refInished.

Call for estimate
RUSH AND CANE SEATING - VENEERING 
OLD TRUNKS COMPLETELY RESTORED 

J. R. Steele, 823-9097 900 Braidfoot, Silverton
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Letters To The Editor Floyd County Library gets new books

Continued From Page 2
judge who served their time with a great
sense of humor for the March of Dimes.

The March of Dimes has videos and 
literature available to anyone needing 
materials on birth defects.

Thanks again Floydada — See you 
next year for the second annual Jail and 
Bail.

Sincerely, 
Linda Ellis 

South Plains Community 
Service Director

Mr. Towery,
I grew up in Roydada but have not 

lived there for many years. Do pass thru 
and visit occasionally with a few old- 
timers, and subscribe to the Hesperian 
so as to keep up with those I remember.

I really enjoy your columns and agree 
with your political philosophy. Keep up 
the fight.

I am enclosing my check to pay for a 
subscription to the Hesperian for some­
one from Floydada or Floyd County 
who is presently serving in the armed 
forces in Saudi Arabia. I’ll appreciate 
your picking someone, since I have no 
acquaintances there of that age. If this 
doesn’t cover the cost, let me know.

Thank you, 
Sam S. Rutledge 

Garland, Texas

We extend a special thank you to Scott 
Faulkcnbeiry and Ronnie Graham for 
donating the pumi^ins. We also would 
like to thank The First National Bank, 
for furnishing the banners that make our 
Town Square look so festive on special 
occasions throughout the year.

Thanks to all the race sponsors for 
your donations. Most of all we want to 
thank the citizens of Floydada for sup­
porting our efforts by your attendance 
and participation in this event

Sincerely, 
Betty Marquis, Mgr.

The Chamber of Commerce and 
The 1990 Punkin Day Committee

Dear Alice:
The Chamber of Commerce and the 

Punkin Day Committee would like to 
thank everyone who helped make our 
celebration a great success.

Our special thanks to the employees of 
the City of Floydada. To Connie Gal­
loway and the Electric Utilities Crew, 
also to Jim Green and the Street Depart­
ment Crew. Our thanks also to the Police 
Department and James Hale. Thank you 
all for a job well done.

We would also like to thank Brent 
Crossland and Mary True for their help, 
and for the use of their facilities. Thanks 
to Bill Smith for the use of the PA 
system, and to Nick Long for a fantastic 
job of announcing.

To all who furnished equipment, 
fences, cows, tables, chairs, and to all 
who loaded and set up for the games, our 
thanks.

Letter to the Editor:
I would like to respond to the state­

ment made by write-in candidate Rose­
mary Segura. The 42 juvenile cases this 
office has handled this past year were 
related to traffic offenses and some alco­
hol law violations, i.e. minor in posses­
sion of alcohol and public intoxication. 
The only connection the JP’s office has 
with drop-outs is by school personnel 
filing on the parents for thwarting com­
pulsory attendance law Article 4.25 of 
the Texas Education Code. The Judge of 
Peace Justice Court has no directauthor- 
ity over juveniles and school atten­
dance.

I wholeheartedly agree with the state­
ment that 80 per cent of prisoners of the 
Texas Department of Corrections were 
drop-outs. I again agree it is much 
cheaper on tax payers to educate our 
youth and possibly keep them from 
becoming expensive inmates. The of­
fice of the JP handles a wide variety of 
offenses, but I felt it needed to be clari­
fied as to the relation between the Justice 
of the Peace and juveniles.

Thank you, 
Kathy Himes

I am a tax payer! I did not give anyone 
permission to represent me in any form 
on the hospital tax issue, nor did a lot of 
other tax payers.

I wonder if Vicki has ever had to rush 
to the emergency room in the middle of 
the night with her Mother or anyone near 
or dear to her? I have many times and 
was very glad to be only minutes away 
from bained, professional help. It dis­
turbs me very much to think I might be 
facing a race in the middle of the night to 
Lubbock. I wonder have you ever given 
these things a thought?

We have always been treated with 
loving, professional care when we have 
needed the hospital and their excellent 
staff to help us.

We are not happy when taxes are 
raised, but will gladly pay our share in 
order that we have a hospital. If our 
hospital closes, we also will lose Doc­
tors, our nursing home, pharmacies, and 
the chain reaction will go on and on. 
Pcc^Ie have to have jobs and will go 
elsewhere to find them, lots of people 
arc not willing to live where there is no 
medical care.

I have never gone to the Doctor’s 
office and been charged $25.00 for an 
office call. It was $25.00 with a shot, 
office calls are $18.00.

I understand that Methodist hospital 
has agreed to waive the repayment to 
them by our hospital district.

I think people need to think about the 
effect this will have on our community!

Please Vote Against The Tax Roll 
Back!

A Tax Payer!
Doris Nixon

Dear Editor:
I would like to ask Vicki Webster 

some questions.
First, I would like to know who and 

what is the Floyd County Tax Payer’s 
Association? Why were all tax payers 
not notified of the Association forming? 
Who are the officers and members? 
Where and when docs the association 
meet?

Dear Editor,
Being a resident of Crosbyton, I am 

not a regular reader of your newspaper. 
However, last week I was encouraged to 
read the Letters to the Editor section 
because Crosbyton Clinic Hospital was 
mentioned in a letter from Molly 
Stringer, Director of Nurses at Caprock 
Hospital. Being the administrator of 
Crosbyton Clinic Hospital, I naturally 
was interested in the information ad­
dressed by Ms. Stringer.

Overall, I feel Molly’s letter was very 
informative and valuable. I empathize 
with the governing board, administra­

tion, and physicians of Caprock Hospi­
tal and the long, stressful hours they 
must be expending in looking after Uk  
best interests of the hospital and the 
people it serves. However, I must set the 
record straight about the comparative 
information shared by Molly regarding 
Crosbyton Clinic Hospital.

In her letter, Molly indicated: “As for 
Crosbyton Hospital who has a census of 
13 patients daily and 80 employees in 
their hospital and clinic, they have three 
more patients daily but 33 more employ­
ees to take care of those three patients. 
How does this compare?”

In answer to Ms. Su-inger’s question, 
let me point out the following accurate 
statistics since she initiated the issue:

1. The year-to-date average daily 
census of Crosbyton Clinic Hospital is 
14.9 as of today (10/29/90), not 13. The 
14.6% difference really is a big differ­
ence for a rural hospital.

2. Crosbyton Clinic Hospital has 70.0 
full-time equivalent (FTE) employees, 
not 80 employees; 59.0 FTE employees 
in the hospital and 11.0 FTE employees 
in the clinic. In other words, we have 59 
employees caring for and serving 
roughly 15 hospital patients pter day 
(about 4.0 FTE per occupied bed), and 
11.0 FTE employees assisting our phy­
sicians in their busy office practices 
(over 1,300 patient visits last month; 
still climbing due to the addition of new 
physician).

I hqpe this information might be of 
value to Ms. Stringer and other con­
cerned citizens. I wish the best of luck 
and inspiration to Leroy, governing 
board members and physicians as they 
work together to keep the doors of 
Caprock Hospital open.

Sincerely, 
David D. Clark 
Administrator, 

Crosbyton Clinic Hospital

New in Fiction:
M urder at the National Cathedral 

by Margaret Truman 
The Plains of Passage by Jean Auel 
The Big Garage on Clearshot by 

Tom Bodett
Lady Boss by Jackie Collins 
Under Siege by Stephen Coonts 
Spy Sinker by Len Deighton 
Snare of Serpents by Victoria Holt 
Time Bomb by Jonathan Kellerman 
Four Past M idnight by Stephen 

King
The First Man in Rome by Colleen 

McCullough
Buffalo Girls by Larry McMurlry
Harvest by Belva Plain
King’s Oak by Anne Rivers Siddons

The Last Raven by Craig Thomas

New in Nonfiction:
The Cat and the Curmudgeon by 

Cleveland Amory
Friday Night Lights by H.G. Bissin- 

ger
Millie’s Book by Barbara Bush 
Now You Know by Kitty Dukakis 
Tom Landry: An Autobiography 

by Tom Landry
Bootlegger’s Boy by Barry Switzer 
You Can Curve Fantastic Jack-0- 

Lanterns by Rhonda J. Hart 
You Just Don’t Understand by 

Deborah Tannen
Giving Sorrow Words by Candy 

Lightner

Vote For
Randy Hollums

District Judge 

110th

Judicial District

"I Pledge as District Judge:

1. To give careful consideration to all matters that come before the court;

2. To listen attentively to all testimony occuring in the courtroom and 
base my decision on the facts and law as they are presented to me;

3. To perform the duties of the District Judge in a business-like manner;

4. To safeguard the rights of the public to speedy Justice, while at the 
same time allowing the parties to a dispute a reasonable amount of time 
to prepare for trial;

5. To conduct myself at all times in a manner that befits the office I hold;

6. To treat jurors, witnesses and attorneys courteously;

7. To be punctual and prepared to proceed in a professional manner at the 
time set by the court."

Randy Hollums
Paid by Teresa Hollums, CampaiRii Treasurer, 711 W. Virginia. Floydada, T » .  79235. (806) 98.1-3753

BOARD OF DIRECTORS 
Zone 1 - Ricky Mosley 
Zone 2 - Junior Taylor 
Zone 3 - Le.slie Nixson Jr. 
Zone 4 - Leon Ferguson 
Zone 5 - J.O. Dawdy

Floyd County
Soil and Water Conservation District

TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE 
U.S.D.A. • Soil Conservation Service 
U.S.D.A. BUILDING - Highway 70 East 
JON J. LA BAUME, District Conservationist

1990 Annual Report
Floyd County SWCD celebrates 50 years

April 30, 1990, marked the Golden 
Anniversary of the Floyd County Soil 
and Water Conservation District. A 
petition was signed and submitted to the 
State Soil Conservation Board Septem­
ber 7,1939, by W.H. Nelson. On Octo­
ber 5,1939, the Stale Soil Conservation 
Board held a public hearing in the Dis­
trict Courtroom in Floydada; the appli­
cation was affirmed November 6,1939.

An Election to form the District was 
granted by the State Soil Conservation 
Board on March 9, 1940. The election 
was held and four voting boxes were 
polled for a total of 270 votes. 181 for 
and 89 against. All landowners of Floyd 
County were eligible to vote. The State 
Soil Conservation Board gave the final 
approval March 18, 1940. The charter 
was granted April 30,1940, making it 
one of the first Soil and Water Conserva­
tion Districts in the State of Texas.
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LEADERS C E L E B R A T E -C onservation  leaders celebrate golden ann iversa ry  in 
FloydCounty. Looking at the original charter are the present Floyd County Soil and W ater 
District Board of Directors. They are from left to right, J.O. Dawdy, Leslie Nijcson, Keith 
JacKson, Junior Taylor, Leon Ferguson and Jon La Baume, SCS District Conservationalist.

ACCOMPLISHMENTS IN 1990
602 Landowners and/or Operators assisted
300 Landowners and/or Operators applied practice(s)

18 Food Security Act plans prepared.
1,420 Acres planned on 18 FSA plans 

22 Food Security Act practice(s) applied 
2,446 Acres applied on 22 FSA plans 

465 CRP contracts signed since program began 
17,751 Acres on 97 CRP contracts released to ASCS 

97 CRP contracts released to ASCS 
12,362 Acres CRP grass seeded 

133,957 Feet of Terraces installed 
14,270 Feet of Diversions installed 
50,716 Feet of Irrigation Pipeline installed 

1,174 Acres of Irrigation Water Management 
80,412 Acres of Cropland benefitted because 

conservation applied on the land 
7,780 SCS Man-Hours used 
1,800 District Man-Hours Used 

41 News Articles printed 
16 Radio Programs 
1 Display Booth at County Fair 
I Annual Report published 
1 Regional Meeting attended by directors
1 Stale meeting auended by directors 

12 Regular meetings held
2 Special called meetings held

90 Percent attendance by directors at meetings

iriik

District Conservationist Jon J. La Baume is shown examining CRP grass that 
was accidentally burned last fall. The grass has come back, but La Baune stated 
that CRP producers can establish fire guards, producers need to contact the SCS 
office for details. Photo on Aaron Carthel Farm

Conservation work continued during the year on Food Security Act plans 
(FSA), Most of the conservation construction practices (terraces diversions, 
and grassed waterways) have been completed. 95 FSA plans are now in force 
in Floyd County. Photo on Mattie Skinner Farm

Ricky Mosley was elected as Zone I director to serve a four year term. He 
replaces Keith Jackson who chose not to run for re-election. Mosley, a Lockney 
native is and has been involved in community projects to better Floyd County.

. . ' 3 '
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PUMPKIN POKES at rest In front of the Floyd County Historical Museum.
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REPRESENTATIVES OF THE Whirlwind football team were the first ever 

PUNKIN DAY BALLOONS—(l-r)2Lahn Turner, Terry Turner and Barbara winners of the National Pumpkin Pie Relay Race.
Gilliland help an unidentified Webelo blow up “Punkin Day” balloons that 
were given away to children at Saturday’s festivities.

HOME GROWN—Katie Smith, daughter of Bill and Dawnell Smith, won the 
dirt bike, donated by Pay-n-Save and Coca Cola. Her home grown pumpkin 
weighed in at 81 lbs.
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JOE CASAREZ, the overall winner of the 5K, crosses the finish line.
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MARY TRUE stayed busy Saturday morning judging the many contest entries 
under the pavilion. The Floydada cheerleaders registered the entries.

FUN RUN WINNERS were (l-r) Daphna Simpson, 2nd in the 26+ division; Bill 
Smith, 1st in 26+; and Dee Leatherman, 1st in 17-25.
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9-12 FUN RUN WINNERS were (left) Timothy Simpson, 1st place, and 
Victoria Cummings, 3rd.
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ELIZABETH MARIE BERTRAND CHRIS HEARING won best carved 
showed off her pumpkin costume pumpkin 
during Saturday’s activities.

ERIKA MUNIZ won 2nd in the 9-12 
age division of the Fun Run. Not pic­
tured are 1st place winner Timothy 
Simpson and 3rd place, Victoria 
Cummings.

STRIKE! Youngsters tried their hands at Punkin Day’s First pumpkin bowling 
contest. All participants were given prizes.
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' , ‘ j  i
i ,  8 .

m

d e a d  l a s t — Clar Schacht (left) and Larry Ogden (right) were coming in 
dead last, followed by the new ambulance, in the Fat Man’s Race. Schacht and 
Ogden didn’t care and right after this picture was taken, they climbed on the 
ambulance and rode it to the Finish line.

BRITNEE KAY BROTHERTON, 2 
years old, was the youngest person 
ever to participate in the Fun Run.

PUMPKIN HERNIAS?—(l-r) Bill 
Smith, Brent Crossland, Nick Long
and Wally Davis g^ “^mpkin her- p c m PKIN for the second year in a row was submitted by Herman
lias” hauling in Big Mac’s to the „  ____  _______ ________. ____ ____________nias” hauling in Big 
scales for the largest pumpkin contest 
weigh-in.

Hoffman of Panhandle. He won the largest pumpkin division with his 210 lb. 
pumpkin. Hoffman brought two pumpkins from Panhandle to enter in the 
contest.
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GENERAL ELECTION (ELECCION GENERAL)
(Condado da) FLOYD COUNTY, TEXAS

NOVEMBER 6,1990 (6 de noviembre de 1990)

SAMPLE BALLOT (BOLETA DE MUESTRA)
INSTRUCTION NOTE: Vote lor the candidate of your choice In each race by placing an “X” in the equare beeMe the candidate’e name. You 
may caet a etralght-party vote (that is, cast a vota for all the nominees of one party) by placing an *‘X” In the equare beside the name of the 
party of your choice. If you caet a etralght-party vote for all nominees of one party and alao cast a vote lor an opponent of one of that party’s 
nominees, your vote for the opponent will be counted as well as your vota for all the other nominees of tha party for which the straight-party 
vote was cast.
(NOTA DE INSTRUCCION: Vote por el candideto de au preferencia para cada candldatura marcando una "X" an el eapacio cuadrado a la Iz- 
quierda del nombre del candidato. Usted podra votar por todos los candidatos de un solo parUdo politico ("straight ticket") marcando una 
"X"en el espacio cuadrado a la Izquierda del nombre de ese partido politico. SI usted vota por uno de los partidos politicos y tamblen vota 
por el contrincante de uno de los candidatos de dicho partido politico, se contara au voto por el contrincante tanto como au voto por todos 
los demaa candidatos dal partido politico de su preferencia.)

Candidates for. 
(Candidatos pars:)

1— 1 REPUBLICAN PARTY 
1— 1 (Partido Republlcano)

1— 1 DEMOCRATIC PARTY 
>— 1 (Partido Demoeratico)

[— j LIBERTARIAN PARTY 
<— 1 (Partido LIbertarlano)

INDEPENDENT
(Independlente)

WRITE-IN 
(Yolo Eacrtto)

United States Senator
(Senador de los Estados Unidos) D Phil Gramm G Hugh Parmer ID Gary Johnson G

United States Representative, District 13
(Rapresentante de los Estados Unidos, 
Distrito Num. 13)

□  DIckWaterfield G Bill Sarpalius

Qovomor
(Qobernador) D Clayton Williams G Ann W. Richards I ]  JeffDaiell G

Lieutenant Qovernor
(Qobernador Tenlente) □  Rob Mosbacher G Bob Bullock I ]  Tom Owens N . ( y  .. G

Attorney Qoneral
(Procurador General) □  J. E. “ Buster”  Brown G Dan Morales ID Ray E. Dittmar G

Comptroller of Public Accounts
(Contralor de Cuentas Publlcas) □  Warren G. Harding, Jr. G John Sharp □  W il l l^ E .  “ Blir>K{sham G

State Treasurer
(Tesorero Estatal)

G Kay Bailey Hutchison G Nikki Van Hightower □  S uz^ne Love J G

Commissioner of the Qeneral Land Office
(Comislonado de la Oficina General de Terrenos) G Wes Gilbreath G Garry Mauro _^ ID RichafnrCT^naldson G

Commissioner of Agriculture
(Comislonado de Agriculture)

--------------------------------------------------

Q i^ ic k  Perry G Jim Hightower [ G Raren A. Tegtm ^er G

Railroad Commissioner X
(Comislonado de Ferrocarrilas) / G Beau Boulter G Robert (Bob) KfOB^^rV G C .W .a ^ in b re ch e rN ^ G

Chief Justice, Supreme Court /
(Juez Presidente, Code Supreme) / G Tom Phillips G OscarT<^Mauzy '

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 1 f
(Juez, Corte Supreme, Lugar Num. 1) i G John Cornyn X TZr^ne Kelly NA '

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 2 /  
(Juez, Corte Supreme, Lugar Num. 2) t G Charles Ben Howell G Bot^am m age '

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Plaoeyf
(Juez, Corte de Apalaclones Crlmlnales/Lugar Num. 1) G Joseph A. (Joe) D ev^y

. .  . J  * ■

G FrankMalonliy

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Ptioe 2
(Juez, Corte de Apalaclones Crlmlnales, Lugar Num. 2)

G OliverJS. Kitzman Sajy^ouston Clinton

//
Judge, Court of Criminal AppealwPlaoe 3
(Juez, Corte de Apalaclones Crlrajnales, Lugar Num. \ G Bill White G Carol Caul •

Judge, Court of Criminal A p p e a l Place 4,,U*<dx^red Term
(Juez, Corte de Apalaclones Crlrmq$teefTugar Num. 4, 
Termino no Complelado)

G David Berchelmann / G Charles F. (Charlie) Baird

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 5, UnexpIred Term
(Juez, Corte de Apalaclones Crlmlnales, Lugar Num. 5, 
Termino no Completado)

G Louis E. Sturns j G Morris L. Overstreet

Stats Representative, District 84
(Rapresentante Estatal, Distrito Num. 84) G Warren Chisum

Chief Justice, 7th Court of Appeals District
(Juez Presidente, Corte de Apalaclones, 
Distrito Num. 7)

G Charles L. Reynolds

District Judge, 11 (Nh Judicial District
(Juez del Distrito, Distrito Judicial Num. 110th) G Randy Hollums G

County Judge
(Juez del Condado) G Bill Hardin

District Clerk
(Secretarlo del Distrito) G Barbara Edwards

County Clerk
(Secretarlo del Condado) ^ G Margaret Collier

County Treasurer
(Tesorero del Condado) G Glenna Orman

County Commissioner, Precinct No. 2
(Comislonado del Condado, Precinto Num. 2) G Floyd Jackson

County Commissioner, Precinct No. 4
(Comislonado del Condado, Precinto Num. 4) G Howard Gene Bishop

Justice of the Peace, Precincts 1 8  4 
(Juez de Paz, Precinto Num. 1 y 4)

G Lowell Bilbrey G

Justice of the Peace, Precincts 2 8  3
(Juez de Paz, Precinto Num. 2y3) G Dottle Stansell G

No.1

PROPOSED CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENT (ENMIENDA PROPUESTA A LA CONSTITUCION)

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Place an “X" In the square beside the atatemsnt Indicating the way you wlah to voto. (Marque con una "X" el cuadro al lado de la trase qua 
Indica la manera an qua quiera usted voter.)

□  FOR (A FAVOR DE)

□  AOMHSl(ENCONTRADE)

“The conatitutlonal amendment to clarify the authority of the senate to consider certain nominees to state and district offices and to provide 
for filling vacancies In those offlcee."
("Enmienda conatituclonal qua aclare la autorldad del Senado para conalderar el nombramlento de personas designadas para ocupar cargos 
estaiales y distrltales, as! como el procedimlento para designer a personas qua ocupen tales cargos cuando esios se encuentren vacantes.")
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cow PATTY BINGO, a real crowd pleaser, resulted in a total of $1000 being divided between a total of six people. A NEW ATTRACTION at the festivities this year were turous drivers made the rounds all day. 
Charlie's Chariots Go Carts. The track was busy as ad ven-

%

COREY JOHNSTON was the overall 
Fun Run winner.
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Funkin' Day Contest Results
5K RACE
14-18 year old
Michael Aleman, 19:39.6, 1st; Ron­

nie Hernandez, 19:44.7, 2nd; Jamie 
Suarez, 20:30.3, 3rd

19-29 year old
Jeff Reccer, 21:32.9, 1st; Jim Ham- 

bright, 21:33.3, 2nd; Kay Brotherton, 
25:34.2, 3rd

30-39 year old
Joe Casarez, 18:11.3 (overall win­

ner), Juan Vasquez, 26:22.8, 2nd; Lan- 
ell McCandless, 29:02.8, 3rd

40-plus
Joey Thacker, 20:48.6,1st; John Slal- 

cup, 23:05.9, 2nd; P.icky Gonzales, 
26:55.3, 3rd

FUN RUN
6-8 year old
Justin McGuire, 1st; Tyrcll Fuller, 

8:18.6,2nd; Amanda Williams, 8:42.2, 
3rd

9-12 year old
Timothy Simpson, 7:02.7, 1st; Erika 

Muniz, 7:06.1, 2nd; Victoria Cum­
mings, 7:18.5, 3rd

13-16 year old
Corey Johnston (overall winner) 

5:52.7
17-25 year old
Dee Leathcrman, 8:45.3
26-plus
Bill Smith, 8:20.8; Daphna Simpson,

9:41

STROLLER RACE 
1 St - Julianne Cornelius; 2nd - Brenda 

Heflin; 3rd - Lori Battey

FAT MAN’S RACE 
David Manley

HOME GROWN PUMPKIN
Katie Smith, 81 lbs.

GUESS THE WEIGHT OF THE 
PUMPKIN

Karen Jones, $25.00, with her guess 
of 8,420 lbs. The pumpkins weighed 
8,390 lbs.; Travis Jones was second and 
Nick Long was third.

COW PATTY BINGO
Because the first bingo (which was 

worth $200.00) landed on a nameless 
square, the money was added to the first 
place prize. The second place prize of 
$300.00 was divided between Bob 
Vickers and Kim Kitto (of Lubbock) 
when their bingo splattered. The first 
place bingo splatter^ four ways, which 
divided $700.00 between; Juanita 
Stepp, Darlene Fulton, Rosa Lopez and 
Monte Williams.

DRAWING C O N T F ^
Children under 13

Kindergarten and under - Angela 
Prather, Kirk Tardy, Galen Smith 

1st and 2nd grade - Robin Kirk, 
Amanda, Ashley Hale 

3rd and 4th grade - Meredith Schacht, 
Katie Sanders, Paul Ross 

5th and 6th grade - Katie Smith, 
Bobby Luna, Amanda Fawver

CARVING CONTEST 
Children 13 and over 
Chris Dearing, Alfredo M., Dawnell 

Smith

PUMPKIN ROLLING RACE
12 and under
Andy Casarez, 1st: Bobby Luna, 2nd; 

Lisa Martinez, 3rd
13 and 29 years
Ray Morales, 1st; Todd Keller, 2nd; 

Autora Reyes, 3rd 
30 and over
Joe Casarez, 1st; Joe Martinez and 

Danny Nixon, 2nd, tic

WHEELBARROW RACE 
HulonCarthcl and Lennic Gilroy, 1st, 

23.86; 2^cha Harris and Carrie Emcrt, 
2nd, 32.94; Brandi Ross and Todd 
Keller, 3rd, 37.72

PUMPKIN PIE RELAY
Whirlwind Football Team 
SMALLEST PUMPKIN 
Gladys Jones

LARGEST PUMPKIN 
Herman Hoffman, 210 lbs.

UGLIEST GOURD 
JuraLcc Jones

PRETTIEST CORN 
Christa Griffin, 1st; Betsy Smith, 2nd; 

Katie Smith, 3rd

BEST PAINTED PUMPKIN
12 and under
Christy Hale, 1 st; Cassy Fawver, 2nd; 

Kylan Sanders, 3rd; Cassy Fawver, 
Honorable Mention

13 and over
Gayle Hale, 1 st; Shea Sanders, 2nd; 

Tanya Hinkle, 3rd

BEST CARVED PUMPKIN
12 and under
Jalie Robnett, 1st; Meredith Schacht, 

2nd; Danny Huggins, 3rd
13 and over
Kelli Williams, 1st; Misty Bertrand, 

2nd; Kelli Williams, 3rd

BEST PUMPKIN PIE
Darlynn Hambright, 1st; Elisha Mor­

ris, 2nd; Karen Miller, 3rd

TONY POWELL won a special 
award for completing the Fun Run.
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CROWDS GATHERED to view those sentenced to jail time carving pumpkins. ARTS AND CRAFTS BOOTHS stayed busy for early Christmas shoppers.
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CONCENTRATION—Ages varied in the pumpkin of face on their personal pumpkin, in a one minute time 

CARVING CONTEST—These contestants raced the clock with only three minutes to carve out a pumpkin. drawing contest, but all were determined to get some kind limit.
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5K WINNERS were (back row, l-r) Juan Vasquez, Mi- Stalcup; (front, l-r) Jim Hambright, Joe Casarez, Lanell 
chael Aleman, Ronnie Hernandez, Jaime Suarez, John McCandless, and Joe Thacker.
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SERVING YOUR TIME—^These jailbirds had to carve pumpkins before 
being released from jail.
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PUMPKIN DRAWING WINNERS were (back row, l-r) ers, Katie Smith, Meredith Schacht, Paul Ross, Robin 
Bobby Luna, Amanda Fawver Galen Smith, Katie Sand- Kirk, Angela Prather; (front) Ashley Hale.
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PUMPKIN PIE RELAY RACE—Larry Guthrie and one made it to the end with a pie as they all slid off the plate 
Clar Schacht are seen here running and eating their before the finish line, 
pumpkin pie in the very messy pumpkin pie relay race. No

GETTING IN LINE—Youngsters ready their pumpkins before the start of the fast paced Pumpkin Rolling Race.
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PUMPKIN TOSS—All youngsters were awarded prizes was trying for a shot at the third bucket,
for their efforts in the Great Pumpkin Toss. This little girl

FAT MAN’S RACE—Good natured souls who partici- Larry Ogden hiding behind him), Randy Duke, Bobby 
pated in the Fat Man’s Race were (l-r) Clar Schacht (with Gilliland, Jesse Morales, David Manley and S.D. Himes.
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6-8 FUN RUN WINNERS were (l-r) Justin McGuire, 1st; Tyrell Fuller, 2nd, 
and Amanda Williams, 3rd. Photos in this section 

were taken by staff.

■m

‘j'"-. I

X  * >2 LV

RIGHT- RIGHT!—These wheelbarrow racers were just through a maze of pumpkins, 
one of the many teams who tried to navigate blindfolded


