
I# ' >•>' -0

TODAY'S WEATHER
■IG SPRING AND VICINITY: 

Partly r M y .  w M y a id  caaler 
thrMgh iMdabt. Fair aad mild 
Taeadav. W A  today M; Low to- 
■IkM M; H1^tooMCTtw 7S. Big Spring daily herald

INSIDE THE HERALD

a  4 I«
00

37th Year N n  Member Audit Bureau of Clrculatloiu
A J O  Member Aaaodated Proof Big Spring, Texas, (79721) Monday, March 29, 1965 5̂  Daily . . , 15̂  Sunday

Quake Opens Earth
the earth at Uay- 

of SaoUago, Chile, after earthqaaie
shook the 

m a y  areas.

A thoelest hoy staado over a crack
Llaj, 7* Biiles aorth of Saatlago. C__ . ___ __
haricd the village of El Cohre, Saaday. The fiULke 
ceatral rcftloa of Chile aad left deca h r ro v t  la as 
(AP WIREPHOTO)

Quake Buries 
Village Of 400

Must Shut 
Door All 
The Way
WASHINGTON (AP) -  The 

Supreme Court ruled today an 
employer has “the absolute 
rlgnt” to close his entire busi­
ness for any reason be pleases 
but said the right does not in­
clude the closing of part of hie 
business, no matter what the 
reason.

The decision specifically ap­
plied to Darlington Manufactur­
ing Co., which shut down its 
plant in Darlington, S.C., in 
1156. The National Labor Rela- 
tioos Board said the plant was 
closed to avoid dealing with the 
Textile Workers Union, but 
Darlington said the closing was 
for economic reasons.

Justice John M. Harlan de­
livered the 7-0 decisioo.

Justices Potter Stewart and 
Arthur J. Goldberg took no 
part.

Harlan said that, even if liqui 
datlon of an entire business Is 
motivated by vindictiveness to­
ward a union, the closing is not 
an unfair labor practice.

As to Darlington, Harlan said 
the high tribunal disagreed with 
the U S. Coart of Appeals fcr 
the 4th Circuit that the rlfl^t to 
close an entire business in­
cludes the light to shut down 
part of it, regardless of the rea­
son.

Harlan said that, therefore, 
the case had to go back to the 
labor board for further proceed­
ings on the point of clo^ng part 
of a business.

SANTIAGO, Chile (AP) — A 
massive eaiihquake rumbled 
across central Chile Sunday 
shattering a dam that buried 
village of 400 people under 
deluge of mud and water. At 
lea.st 26 others were killed else­
where. hundreds were injured 
and thousands were left home­
less.

Only eight villagers were 
known to have escaped when 
the 290-foot-hi^ dam ourst, cas­
cading two n ^ o n  tons of mud 
and water on the copper-mining 
village of El Cobre, 80 miles 
north of Santiago.

Between 60 and 70 farmhous­
es and cottages were swept 
away by the torrent that thun­
dered into the valley beneath 
the dam.

GIGANTIC WA\T 
“It was like a gigantic wave, 

more than 100 feet high, made 
of sand, mud and water," said 
one survivor, Carlos Munchel 

“ It came on top of us, but I 
managed to run to a nearby hill 
Mlien I looked over my shoulder 
the avalanche had jessed al 
ready and then I could not see 
the houses any more.”

President E d u a r d o  Fret

toured the stricken areas by 
plane and helicopter. He told 
newsmen that the situation was 
under control and praised the 
people for remaining calm and 
helping in rescue efforts

“The situation in El Cobre is 
terrible," Frei said, "but it is 
fortunate it was confined to this 
small area."

FRESH SLIDES 
irp after-shocks continued 

through the night but the onl
Sha 
rou]̂

major result reported was 
rockslides

only
fresh

on

LOS ANGELES (AP) -  A 
description of the getaway car 
is the only clue police say they 
have to four hooded gunmen 
who robbed a plush Wilshlre 
Boulevard salon of 1500,000 in 
gems in five minutes.

The men fled in a 1964 metal­
lic blue sedan after throwing a 
smoke bomb to cover their exit 
from the Laykin Jewelry salon 
at the I. Magnin department 
store.

Even the car’s license plates 
were stolen, police said, making 
tracing more difficult.

The men barged into the store 
Saturday morning, shouting to 
terrify customers and employes.

One gunman forced at least a 
dozen persons to lie in the floor, 
while his confederates used 
steel rods to smash glass dis­
play cases. They scoopMod emer­
alds, diamonds, rubies and sap­
phires into a brown duffle bag.

the highways 
Crews were working to clear the 
slides and repair road damage 
All main roods were open, but 
detours were necessary on 
many.

The quake shook the 2.650- 
mile-long mountain nation from 
end to end. but it hit hardest In 
the central provinces of Acon­
cagua, V al^raiso, Coquimbo 
and Santiago, where a third of 
the South American nation’s 7.8 
million people live.

Dead and injured were report­
ed in dozens of cities Scores of 
fires broke out.

KILLED 5,Ml
The upheaval was the worst 

the quake-prone nation has suf 
fered since May 1960, when an 
earthquake and tidal wave 
killed an estimated 5.000 pemie 

Heaviest destruction in Sun 
day’s earthquake was reported 
in communities Just north of the 
capital.

At Valparaiso, Chile’s second 
largest city and largest port 60 
m i ^  northwest of Santiago, 
two deaths were reported 
About a third of the houses were 
reported destroyed or heavily 
damaged.

In Llay-Llay a rail and high 
way Junction 50 miles above 
Santiago, almost every building 
was destroyed or heavily dam­
aged

HOMES SHATTERED
In Nogales, 65 miles north of 

Santiago, families moved from 
their shattered homes into the 
streets for the night.

Devastation was also reported 
in the towns of San Felipe, Los 
Andes, La Liqua, Cabildo and 
Illapel, all north of the capital

In Santiago, one person was 
reported killed and about 40 in­
jured as they fled from shaking 
Duildings.

Cave-ins at a sandpit at Quil- 
lota, near Llay-Llay, trapped 
about 100 miners, but most es­
caped.

D.S. Leads 
In Unmanned 
Space Feats
CAPE KENNEDY, Fta. (AP) 

-  With the flight of the “Molly 
the United Stateg 

gained ground on the Russians 
in the man-in-space race. With 
Ranger 9, this nation clearly 
demoostratad its lead in un­
manned exploration of the uni­
verse.

The pair of spectacular lauch 
ings from Cape Kennedy in the 
past week helped remove-some 
of the sting inflicted by the So­
viet feat M March 18 in which 
two men shot into orbit and one 
of them became the first man to 
step outside his capsule and 
take a stroll in space.

Most U S officials concede

Crowds Turn 
Out In Rain 

For Spacemen

the rain for the

NEW YORK (AP) -  Goods 
masked the sky today as astro­
nauts Virgil 1. Grissom and 
John W. Young reached New 
York City to receive its classic 
outpourinig of acclaim for Amcr 
lean heroes.

The pair landed at La 
Guardia Airport, where crowds 
had waited in 
moment.

A police detail and armed 
forces honor guards also offered 
their salutes, along with cheers 
from spectators, as America’s 
first dual tr.velers in space 
stepped from a plane

It arrived from Florida, 
where the two had spent the 
weekend after their pioneering 
two-man orbital flight last Tues­
day

Boycott End 
Is (Credited 
To Governor

|lmpeach-Wallace 
Drive Shapes

Court Upholds 
Lock-Out Right
WASHINGTON (AP) -  The 

Supreme Court ruled today that, 
when an impa.sse is reached in 
labor contract negotiations, an 
employer may bring economic 
pressure on a union by tempo­
rarily locking out his workers.

Justice Potter Stewart, in de­
livering the court’s unanimous 
decision, said that it is not an 
unfair labor practice for an em­
ployer to adopt such a proce­
dure “ in support of his legiti­

mate bargaining position."
Stewart’s opinion was in a 

case specifically affecting 
American Ship Building Co., 
which has yards on the Great 
Lakes. Stewart said the record 
did not show that the employer 
had acted to discourage union 
membership, or to discriminate 
against union members. He said 
the purpose and effect of the 
lockout was only to bring pres­
sure upon the union to modify 
its demands.

that the Soviet Union has about 
a two-year lead in the man-in 
space sweep.stakes. But they 
feel that U. S development of 
the world’s most powerful rock 
et, billions of dollars worth of 
new equipment and bolder deci- 
.sions eventually will enable this 
nation to come out ahead in the 
race to the moon

MILLIONS WATCH
American confidence is di.s- 

played in the openness with 
which the space agency con 
ducts its programs. Several 
hundred newsmen from many 
parts of the world covered the 
Ranger-Gemini doubleheader. 
Millions watched on live televi 
Sion .

The public was told it could 
turn on television sets Wednes 
day and see Ranger 9’s close-up 
moon pictures as they were 
transmitted. If the spacecraft 
had failed, the National Aero­
nautics and Space Administra­
tion would have had egg on Its 
face. But it didn’t—and millions 
of persons had ringside seats to 
one of history’s most dramatic 
shows.

The openness contrasts with 
the secrecy which shrouds So­
viet space efforts. When astro­
nauts Virgil I. Grissom and 
John W. Young and their Molly 
Brown craft missed the landing 
point by about 60 miles, thie 
world was told almost immedi­
ately. When cosmonauts Pavel 
Belyayev and Alexei Leonov 
missed their target by about 500 
miles and landed in a snowbank 
last week, Soviet officials didn’t 
even hint about It until two days 
later.

STARTED FIRST
The Soviet Union has built its 

space lead mainly because it 
started several years ahead of 
the United States to develop 
mammoth booster rockets capa­
ble of lifting heavy payloads.

'The American space agency 
is counting on the huge Saturn 5 
rocket to overtake the Russians 
and eventually beat them to the 
moon. NASA Administrator 
James Webb described the Sat­
urn 5 as “very much larger 
t h a n  anything the Russians 
seem to be building that we 
know of." Even if t te  Russians 
had such a rocket ready to 
launch, he said, they still would 
have a long period of develop- 
m m t ahead.

JONESBORU, La. (AP) -  
Gov. John J. McKeithen’s ex­
traordinary effort to ease redal 
tension here ended a Negro high 
school boycott today.

The p u ^  voted to return to 
classes at Jackson High pending 
the outcome of conferences be­

en a N ^ro  parent-student 
committee and the Jackson 
Parish School Board.

FROM CAPITAL 
HcKeitben flew here from 

Baton Rouge Saturday to bear 
4egro grievances and talk with 

leaders on both sides.
Negro leaders had nredicted 

that this little north Louisiana 
town was potentially “another 
Selma."

The Ku Klux Klan fired some 
crosses here and elsewhere in 
xNiislana Saturday night and 

Sunday after the governor’s vis­
it but qo Incidents were report­
ed. A N e m  march to the d ty  
tall shortly after dark Sunday 

was quiet
TOURS GROUNDS 

McKeithen conferred with a 
Negro delegation at the high 
s d m l, then toured the building 
and grounds.

The governor promised some 
Immediate aid — particularly in 
regard to sending in new text­
books to replace those which 
are outdated or worn out.

Demonstrations in Jonesboro 
were triggered by the student 
boycott of all-Negro Jackson 
High March 8 after a false ru­
mor that the football coach was 
to be fired for civil rights activi­
ties.

Bank Swindle 
Probe Likely
HILLSBORO (AP)— The HiU 

County grand Jury is expected 
to investigate charges of bank 
swindling when it goes into ses­
sion Tuesday.

R. L. Cowan, president of the 
Covington State Bank, swore 
out a swindling complaint Fri­
day against Jesse Neagle, 25, 
Itasca car dealer.

Dist. Atty. Tom Beard said 
Neagle was released late Satur­
day after posting $10,000 bond.

Beard declined to di.sclose the 
amount of the alleged swindle 

‘All that will come out in the 
grand Jury action," he said.

Officials of the Federal De­
posit Insurance Corp. and the 
State Banking Commission have 
been investlr^ting conditions at 
the Covington bank for several 
days.

Iz
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Cong Decides To Talk
With the persaasiM •( a Viet Caag-aude 
spear pressed agalast his threat, this cap- 
tared t'iet Ceag gaerrilla decided to talk te 
latcrregaten tellMc tbeni abeat a cache ef 
Chlaese grenades. He was captared with 13

17 saspects whenether gaeirillas and 
Vietaamese battaUeos everraa a Viet Ceog 
camp abeat IS miles senthweat ef the Da 
Naag air force base. (AP WIREPHOTO)

U.S. Navy Bombers Pound 
Radar Installations Of Cong
SAIGON, Viet Nam (AP) -  

Forty-two U.S. Navy fighter- 
bombers struck again today at 
North Viet Nam’s radar instal 
lations on Bach Long Island, 
following up a raid Friday 
against that military target in 
tlw Gulf of Tonkin.

Enemy ground fire downed a 
Skyhawk Jri in the area. The pi­
lot was reported rescued unin­
jured.

13th RAID
The attack was the 13th in a 

.series of raids launched against 
North Viet Nam Feb. 7. Bach 
Long, only 80 miles west of Red 
China’s Hainan Island and 100 
miles south of the Chinese 
mainland, is the northoumost 
point to be hit.

The Bach Long radar station 
was first hit last Friday, in the 
13th attack on North Viet Nam. 
The island is about 140 miles

southeast of Hanoi, 100 miles 
south of the Chinex mainland 
and 80 miles west oi Hainan, a 
big Chinese island that is a base 
for MIG interceptors.

HALT SHIPPING
Six Japanese shipping firms 

deckled today to halt sailing of 
their freighters to North Viet­
namese ports becauw of in­
creased risk to shipping in 
North Vietnamese waters. 'The 
six firms had 10 ships making 
monthly calls to North Viet 
Nam, hauling an annual total of 
about 500,000 tons of coal from 
North Viet Nam’s Hongey 
mines to Japan.

A powerful Viet Cong unit 
smashed a government militia 
outpost 17 miles from the North 
Vietnamese border today, kill­
ing 24 defenders.

The Communists also wound-

Unofficial 'Vandalism  
Season' Starts Agoin
WASHINGTON (AP) — The 

unofficial “vandalism season’ 
begins this week, an April 
through-November period high­
lighted by the smashing of 
school windows.

The malicious destruction of 
school property costs local tax-

Assault Charged, 
Woman Shot Twice

A charge of assault with In­
tent to murder was filed In Jus­
tice of the Peace Jess Slaugh 
ter’s c o u r t  Sunday against 
Elmo Henry, 38, whom police 
arrested shortly after his wife, 
Mrs. Patsy Ann Henry, 26. was 
found with xvera l gunshot 
wounds in her 'lead.

She was found on the front 
orch of her residence at 428 
yon Street after police re­

ceived a call that she had been 
shot. Mrs. Henry was reported 
in critical condition Sunday 
night at Cowper Ginic-Hospital, 
and her condition was described 
as fair this morning.

Henry was released on $10,- 
000 lx>nd Sunday night.

Officer Ted Lancaster said he 
arrived at the houx shortly aft 
er 5 p.m. Sunday, and that Hen 
ry handed him a .32 caliber pis 
toL

Henry told officers he had 
gone to the lioux to take his 
wife to work at a local restau­
rant. He gave officers a state­
ment concerning the Incident 
According to police, Henry said 
he and his wife had been es­
tranged for about two months. 
They have one daughter who 
Uves with her mother.

Dalton White, 48, also an em­
ploye of the restaurant, said he 
was standing at the front door­
way of the Iou.se talking to 
Mrs. Henry when the shooting 
occurred, according to police 
White told officers he ran from 
the porch and down the street 
when the shooting began, and 
that x v e r .“1 shots were fired at 
him.

Officers said Mrs."Henry had 
been shot twice, in the forehead 
and the throat. Mrs. Henry was 
taken to the hosptUl by Big 
Spring Ambulance Service.

payers millions of dollars a 
year.

The toll In New York City for 
the 196.1-64 school year was $1,- 
254,989. In Chicago it was $883,- 
025. iQ Bo.ston it was $189,700.

THE WORST?
On another basis, says the 

report of a national survey by 
the Baltimore, Md., public 
schools, the nation’s worst 
record may be In Richmond. 
Va.

However, this may reflect 
more on the thoroughness of 
some of the reports than on Vir­
ginia’s capital.

Richmond reported vandalism 
damage of $122,660, less than 
one-tenth of New York’s, but it 
repre.sents a cost of $2.70 for 
each pupil enrolled.

Other per-pupil costs were 
$1.20 in New York City, $1.81 In 
Chicago and $2 in Boston.

At the other end of the scale. 
Omaha. Neb., and El Paso. 
Tex., reported a per-pupil cost 
of vandalism of only three 
cents. The total dollar-oost of 
vandalism was reported as $1,- 
750 in Omaha, and $1,520 in El 
Pa.so.

However, 83 per cent of Rich­
mond’s reported toil was due to 
arson. There was damage of 
slightly more than $100.000 to 
one school alone, all of which 
was recovered by insurance.

The balance of the loss in 
Richmond came from larcenies 
and window breakage. Neither 
El P a x  or Omaha reported any 
larcenies and Omaha, in fact, 
.said all it’s $1,750 damage was 
in window breakaga.

ed five of the defenders and 
captured one. Twenty-five 
weapons and a stock of ammu 
niUon were taken from the post 

YANK KILLED 
A U.S. Army helicopter crew­

man was reported wounded by 
Communist fire in central Viet 
Nam Sunday, and a U.S. Marine 
helicopter pilot, Capt. William 
D. Reynolds of ^ t a  Ana, 
Calif., was killed during an op­
eration 11 miles southwest of Da 
Nang, site of the U.S.-South 
Vietnamex air b a x  for attacks 
on North Viet Nam.

CRAFT DOWNED 
The Marine’s craft was shot 

down by Communist ground 
fire. As the pilot and his four 
pa.s,sengers ran from the wreck­
age, a rotor blade flew off the 
helicopter and struck Reynolds 

About 1.000 Vietnamex army 
troops parti 
tion, during 
prisoners. Vietnamex officers 
claimed five Viet Cong were 
killed.

A bolt of lightning x t  off a 
ring of 40 defensive mines 
around a U.S. Special Forces 
camp in central Viet Nam .Sat­
urday. A U.S. spokesman said 
14 Vietnamex were killed and 
78 other persons, including an

Civil Rights 
Workers Face 
High Barriers

SELMA, AU. (AP) -  CMl 
rights leaden say they wUl 
begin a move in about two 
w c ^  to have Gov. George C. 
Wallace Impeached and to turn 
all of Alabama into one mass 
demonstration in their battle to 
register Negro voten.

“We’re  going to start our next 
campaign at the top and go 
down to the bottom," said the 
Rev. James Bevel in a speech to 
a Negro rally Sunday night.

He told tM group that the 
drive to get Wallace out of of­
fice would be under way by 
mid-April.

WILL EXPAND
1116 civil r i^ t s  movement 

also will expand shortly to the 
steel d ty  of Birmingham, the 
port d ty  of Mobile and to every 
town and hamlet in Alabama, 
u id  Bevel, who Is one of Dr. 
Martin Luther King J r .’s top 
spokesmen.

He declared that demonstra- 
tloBs abo will be stepped up at 
Montgomery, the capital, and 
will t e  taken Into the white resi­
dential aedioiis of Selma la de­
fiance of a directive from a fed­
eral Judge If certain conditions 
are not met to the satisfaction 
of Negroes.

HUGE TASK
Ctvfl

moQumeiital 
get Wallace impeac 
majority of both state legisla­
tive bouses must approve it. A 
resolution asking Impeachment 
of the nvem or must t e  
presented by a Houx member.

Alabama Houx Speaker Al­
bert Brewer said the resolution 
must contain charges that the 
governor has violated x m e  por- 
tioo of the Alabama Constltu- 
tkm and usually would charge 
Incompetence.

If a majority of Houx mem­
bers then pasxd  the resolution, 
a trial would then be held by the 
Senate with the chief Justice of 
the Alabama Supreme Court 
presiding. Then, after charges 
are heard, the TOvemor would 
be impeached only if a majority 
of the Senate voted for it.

“OUR HOMEWORK"
“If we do our homework, I 

believe that by Christmas we 
will have a new governor," said 
Bevel. ‘I would not be surprised 
if we had an election by then."

Bevel said be believes Ala­
bama citizens, both Negro and 
white, are fed up with Wallace. 
He did not go into detail on what 
plan his group would u x  in 
trying to get the impeachment 
campaign going other than to 
mention the group would u x  a 
30-day economic boycott and 
launch a handbill campaign.

In other developments Sun­
day:

King, speaking in San Fran­
cisco, Calif., calW  for a nation­
wide boycott of all Alabama 
products and for the federal 
government to withdraw all its

rights groups faca a 
entai task ia tivlng to 
tUaca impeached as a

American soldier, were injured. I money from the state

Silent 
Klan

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Two 
Ku Klux Klan leaders have 
asked for a face-to-face meet­
ing with President Johnson fol­
lowing his denunciation of the 
organization as “h o o d e d  big­
ots."

'There was no immédiate com­
ment from the President. A 
White Houx .spokesman x k l 
the request made in a telegram 
x n t  by Creorgia Grand Dragon 
Calvin F. Craig and Imperial 
Wizard Robert M. Shelton Jr. 
had been received and routinely 
referred to Atty. Gen. Nicholas 
Katzenbach.

LONELY STRETCH
Johnson attacked the Klan 

Friday when he announced the 
arrest of four Alabama mem­
bers in the nlrtt-rider slaying of 
Viola Gregg Liuzzo, 39, of De­
troit, a white civil rights work- 
X . She was shot on a lonely 
stretch of highway near Selma.

The President called for a 
congressional investigation and 
warned klansmen to quit and 
“return to a decent society — 
before it is too late."

Declared Johnson: "We wiU

not be intimidated by the terror­
ists of the Ku Klux Klan any 
more than by the terrorists o( 
the Viet Cong."

SEEK TALK
The Klan leaders xM , how­

ever, they hoped to talk with the 
President about more than Just 
that criticism.

Craig told newsmen in Atlanta 
It would be unfair of the Presi­
dent to ignore them since he has 
talked personally with dvll 
rights leaders.

“We feel that the President 
has seen left-wing leaders x  
many times that it is only right 
that he recognize the right-wing 
leaders a lx ,” Craig x id .

The presidential request for a 
robe picked up Republican 
lacking during the wxkend. It 

came from fiens. Gifford P. 
C ax  of New Je rx y  and Hui 
Scott of Pennsylvania plus 
members of the Houx.

Houx Democratic L e a d e r  
Carl Albert of Oklahoma pre­
dicted Congress will uphold the 
President by acting swiftly on 
any legislation which ha 
poses.
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Siote Violence 
Dead At 26

. Br Tlw >m d1a< Ihw
The weekend violent death 

toll in Texas reached 28, in­
cluding 16 persons who died in 
traffic accidents.

Five of the deaths were the 
result of shootings, two persons 
drowned, two were crushed and 
one person was burned to death

The Associated Press count 
began at 6 p.m. Friday and 
ended at midnight Sunday.

The victims;
Mary Elizabeth Wise of Big 

Spring died Sunday of injuries 
she received late Friday night 
when hit by a car as she 
crossed U.S. 80 in Big Spring.

Joe Wilson Parum Jr., of 
Frost was killed and five other 
persons were injured Saturday 
night in a one-car accident on 
the Danville Road, about IS 
miles north of Conroe. All were 
students at Sam Houston State 
College, Huntsville.

W illard Dempsey Toombs. 42. 
died Sunday in a welding acci­
dent at the Mangone Shipbuild 
Ing Co., Houston.

HITS POLE
James I. Sammons. 24, of 

Dallas, and William Patrick 
Heasley, 20, of Plano, died ear 
ly Sunday in the crash of a 
sports car into a utility pole at 
Richardson, north of DaBaa. A 
third passenger in the car was 
criticaUy Injured.

Frank Owen Sessions, 48, of 
Kerens, and E. B. Duckworth, 
of Dallas, were killed Saturday 
night in a head-on collision ten 
mDes west of Maybank. on 
State Highway 274.

Nancy Atchison, 17, of Rich­
land Hills, was killed Sunday 
when her car went off a rain- 
slick road and hit a tree The 
accident was on Farm Road

1709, five miles west of Grape­
vine.

Ernie B. David, 18, of Trinity, 
was killed Friday night in a 
one-car accident, two miles 
north of Trinity.

PAIR SHOT 
Delmar Tompkins, a retired 

railroad worker, and his wife 
of several months, were found 
shot to death Sunday in the 

ard of their home in Center, 
loth were about 60. Justice of 

the Peace Hamp Nicholson 
ruled that Tompkins shot his 
wife and then killed himself.

Mrs. Myrtle Morris, 67, was 
killed Sunday in a two-car colli 
Sion four miles east of Weimar 
on U.S. Highway 90. Two other 
persons were injured 

James A. Knight, 21, of Ennis 
died early Sunday in the crash 
of his car into a bri i abut­
ment on the Emhouse Road 
three miles north of Corsicana.

Victor Loera, 70, of Austin 
died Saturday night of injuries 
suffered wh«i struck by two 
cars on Austin’s South Freeway 

O irr OF CONTROL 
Lewis Edward Portley, 17, of 

Longview died Saturday night 
when his car went out of con­
trol and overturned on a Long 
view street. Two other Long 
view youths were injured 

Antonio Nedellin, >9, of Fort 
Worth died Saturdi^ night in a 
tavern «ixinting Iralice ques­
tioned four Latin Americans 

Juan Carlos Reyna. 13, was 
missing and niesumed drowned 

In tne Guadalupe Rlv-

C R O S S W O R D  P U Z Z L E
ACROSS 

I V«c 
5  VarifM  

slaicnwnt 
9 DisMM carriM

14 Sublarfuge
15 Mighty andowed
18 Oickara'Mr. 

Haap
17 Oiacovar
19 Haovan-iant 

windfall
20 Scuipturad figure
21 Showy display
23 Jewel
24 Drags
25 Gasturaao# 

disopprovol
27 Governing body
29 Rouse
30 High in scolo
31 In favor of
32 Nomod tribe«
36 Intimota view:

compound
39 Thoughtful
40 Saroglios
41 Soloon
42 For
43 Slept
45 Morkad by 

destiny
47 Fallow workar
50 Art cult
51 GTsoddraM: 

obbr.
52 AAina tunnel
5 3  -oil tie
56 Ratid«

51 Airplonp 
monauuMK 2 
word«

60 Walk ON
61 For f«or thot
62 Locarotad
63 Epsom~>
64 Sight
65 Snick-ond ■

- DOWM
1 AAortostary 

tanonts
2 Reddish coating
3 AAoving stairway
4 Saasow
5 Clotho, Lochasit, 

’ortd Atropo«
6 Arab coot
7 Fast ship
•  Mole singers 
9 Initiotiva end 

effort
10 Tima period
11 Jewelry items
12 French 

impraasiortlat
13 Countarfeits 
I I  Hod misgiving«

about

22 Foaant
26 Goofs
27 Famed coiMpoaar
28 Pot
29 Sock
31 Puttarad
33 Secretarial 

mottar
34 Bocchiccry
09 rofwqpQ
37 ThroM
38 Gemstone«
39 Baotnik's obode 
41 Insects
44 Knickknock
45 Enthusiasts
46 Experts
47 Suparmort 

feature
48 Music form
49 Book of fiction
50 subtly

unboloncad
54 Concerning: 2 

words
55 Serf
57 Toke 0 snack 
59 Cloopotra's tote

Merak 27,

J£A¿

Saturday 
er near Victmla A companioa

LEASE ANY
MAKF

CARS —  TRUCKS

UNIVERSAL 
CAR LEASINGI

MIDLAND:
223 E. llUnote MU 3-SM

Bbfokb T oo Buy Youn 
N ext  Cak

get the
FACTS
about your 
auto loan! 
here are

partially 
the door

W h y  y o a tb o u l d  
finance y o u r  n e a t  
o r  w itb i

L  LortF-Ooer Fn«AMPcnio 
X  M n n u u i c  M o m t b l t  

PATUKMTB
3 . O m s -Y b a a I m s u s a ik b  

P l a n
4  Vast  Sxbvicm 
5 . L r t e x o k N o

D O W H P A Y M K K t

said young I te p a  went to wash 
some mud Ott his shoes and fell 
Into the water.

FALLS ON HIM
Don Brown, 22, died S 

when a car he was r  
for a friend fell on him 'in the 
driveway of his Houston home

An AbUene mechanic, Rex 
Vernon Jones drowned Saturday 
in T and P Lake near Bahrd 
while on a fishing trip with a 
friend.

Mrs. Earl Gerduig. 58. was 
killed Saturday whm her car 
rolled into the garage of her 
Clehume home and the car 
door slammed on her Police 
said Mrs. Gerdmg was appar 
ently out of the car when it 
started rolling, and she tried to 
stop it but got only 
into the car when 
swung shut

Julius liOrenzen. 79, was killed 
in San Antonin Saturday when 
his car collided head-on with 
another car on a divided ex 
pressway. A witne« said Loren 
zen had been driving along the 
wrong side of the freeway about 
five miles.

Albert Gabriel, 41, of Cypress 
was killed late Friday night 
east of Cypress when his pickup 
truck struck the rear of another 
truck.

CHANGING ‘HRE 
A man changing a tire on his 

car Friday n i^ t  near Big 
Sandy was struck and killed by 
an auto He was Doyle Eaves, 
22. of Winona.

Roy Ochoa. 19. was killed 
Friday night In a burst o* gun 
fire at an east Dallas eating 
place. Another youth was criti 
cally wounded. Police said two 
other youths were involved.

VirgU Lott Jr., 18, was fatally 
in ju r^  in a three-car smashup 
in Austin Friday night.

Elvis DeWayhe Wolf, 37, died 
Saturday in a Houston honital 
about nine hours after a shoot­
ing at an apartment. Elmo Poll- 
day, 37, was charged with mur­
der.

Vicfim In Panama 
Tumult Will Return

LONDON (AP) -  Dr. Roberto 
Arias, husband of Ballerina 
Margot Fonteyn, plans to return 
next fall to Panama, where he 
was gravely wounded in a politi­
cal shooting last year.
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Famed 'Burma 
Surgeon' Dies
RANGOON, Burma (AP) -  

Dr. Gordon S. Seagrave will be 
buried Wednesday at the Bur­
mese hill hospital to which he 
devoted his life. The famed 
“Burma surgeon” died there 
Sunday at the a «  of K.

Burma's top M art specialist.
Dr. Ronald Lwin, flew to Sea- 
grave's bedside at the village of 
Namkham, 800 miles north of 
here, when the U.S.' Embassy 
reported him critically ill last 
Wednesday. The embasay said 
Seagrave was suffering from a 
number of ailments, including a 
weak heart.

TOO LATE
"I arrived there too late,”

Lwin said. “ Hia heart was fail­
ing and his general condition 
was very bad.”

S eam ve lay in his sparsely 
furnished room, dressed In fad-

blue pajamas, on a narrow retary a t a private boys’ school
GORDON SEAGRAVE

bed M ar a window. Nearby was 
an easy chair and toi a canm  
the desk where he wrote his 
best-selling “ Burma Surgeon.” 

While Seagrave’s American 
assistant. Dr. Joseph Newhall. 
and the Burmese nurses labored 
in vain to save the old doctor, 
hundreds of villagers kept a

r [-stricken death watch on 
hospital grounds 

His son. Sterling, telegnphed 
the embassy in Rangoon: 

“Seagrave expired 8238GMT 
Sunday — 9;39 p.m. EST Satur­
day — with his nospltal staff at 
hii side ”

DIES PEACEFULLY 
He slipped peacefully Into 

death.” sak! Dr. Lwin.
Sterling and another 

John, were with their father. 
His wife got the news in Baltl- 
nx)re. M d, where she is a sec

Chinese border. F ra n  a rotUag 
wood building, Seagrave built a 
hospital with 358 beds.

CARED FOR f,IM
It cared for 1,006 patients a 

year and treated an additional 
16,000 a i out-patients. It was the 
only medical facility for 400,000 
p e i ^ s  In'the area.

During World War U, Sea­
grave put his hospital at the 
dispoul of Gen. Joseph W. Stil- 
well and was commusioiied a 
major in the U.S. Army Medi­
cal Corps.

When the Jspanese drove StU-j 
well out of Burma, Seagrave 
made the long retreat to India 
with him. I

The Japanese destroyed his 
hospital, but Seagrave returned 
in 19M to rebuild it,' designing 
and constructing many of tM| 
cobblestoM and cement build­
ings himself, I

I

Fonda Injured In 
Moking Wor Film
SEGOVIA, Spain (AP) -  

American actor Henry Fonda 
suffered a pierced right hand 
Sunday during the shMtiog of 
battle scenes for the movie, 
“The Battle of the Bulge."

GEHING UP 
NIGHTS
A{Wr 3«. ■■■■«■ KM«« ar mUkéárn Ir-rtUUMU aftoa MM« m4 «mt «afe* ia« Ubm aa« B*r*att« traai laa traaaaot M««—»« hau «ay aa4 aWkt. r?iin«hrtlr TU aay daa« ñü aaíUr (ruiMaadMhai. Backaalia aa« fati aM. lira«. 
***' ff**if IfTlUUaa. CTsirSiiM^T bring« (a*t. ratanag aoaiíart br •urbing Irritallag g«raw la «traag, meié tria» an« by anal««ata aala ralW. Oat OVerex ai «ra«guia. ual birtw taat.

She left Burma ia 1949 with m l  
ous recurrent malaria and nev­
e r saw her husband again.

He feared the trip to the 
United States," Mrs. Seagrave 
said Sunday. “ He feared some­
thing would happen on the trip " 

The doctor once said: “The 
oidy way I can prove that 1 
mean everything I ever said to 
the Burmese is that I die right 
here In Burma.”

Seagrave was bom in Burma 
March 18. 1897. His death ended 
135 unbroken years of service to 
Burma by four geMrations of 
the family. None of his four sons 
efd«ed the missionary field.

After taking his m rdkal de­
gree from Johns Hopkins Uni­
versity. he returned with bis 21-

C -old wife to the village of 
ikham. five miles from the

SAGE JOHNSON 
WELCOMES YOU

OH
•  TIrw

SAGE JOHNSON 
MOBIL SERVICE

2jOL

Watt DlsMy’s film "A Tiger 
Walks,” Is “picture animal top 
star of the year.”

The awards, presented Satur 
day night, are sponsored by the 
American HumaM Association

HOLLYWOOD, (AP) -  FUp- 
per, a porpoi.se. and P a tr iu , a 
tiger, are HoUywood't gBlmel 
stars of the year.

Flipper, porpoise star of the 
“ Flipper” television series, was 
named “performing animal tel­
evision star of the year” at the 
13th annual Patsy awards.

Patrina, a tiger featured In

Labor Hears 
Plea On Ruling

Sen
1 upon 
defeat

WASHINGTON (AP) -  
Paul Douglas has called 
labor leaders to help 
congresskMial efforts to modify 
the oM man-oM vote decision of 
the Supretne Court.

The Illinois Democrat said 
“The Supreme Court decision 
ordering the reapportionment 
on a population basis of both 
houses of the state legislature Is 
the new Magna Carta of repre­
sentative government in the 
United States.”

Douglas gave his view in re- 
nurks prepared for a confer­
ence sponsored by the Interna­
tional Union of Electrical, Ra 
dio and Machine Workers.

The, Big Spring Hearing Aid 
Service Center

Will Be In tha SottlM Hotel Every Tuesdaytha Settle« Hotel Every 
Prom 9 to 12 Noon 

pey U 
dim

FREE OF CMARGEI 
«apptte« win be available far aH euket

We will be hapey ta  cteae, adlest, «r «erv Ice yew bear- 
teg AM regardless et euke  ar model

Batterie« aed 
aad madeh.
Far free aflereaae hawe appelatmeat ar battery delivery 
at aa extra ebaree, call AM 4-5551 ar write 
BIO SPRING HEARING AID SERVICE CENTER 

Care el SETTLES H0TI-:L. BIc Sprteg, Texas 
BELTONE HEARING AIDS 

Aadlametrir Hearteg Teat At Na OMIgatlaa

Speed Riggs, 
fam o u s tobacco 
auctioneer 
recommenejs

H fff

u m m a n m
I s  \ n  !

■ TV

 ̂ [.U C K Y
T R IK E

i l l r i ' s

They put 
back the 
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You can ttill gtt Our FiiMst 1964 Rayon ft Nylon Tiret It

REDUCED PRICES!
Rayon Custom 
Super-Cushion
SAME OMMAI-COUIFMCNT TIK TNAT 

CAME ONTHC NEW 1M4CMSI

Nylon Custom  
Super-Cushion

OUR FMEST MM NYLON TIRE 
TESTED UP TO 120 MPN!

Airman Beaten Rescuing 
Girl Returns To Scene

Before you boy yoor
next car, ̂ wsit your SXCi 
office a n d  g q t tfaa fac ia  
about SXC’a Auto Loan

SOUIHWESra»l 
INVESTMENT 
OIMPANr

591 East Third 
BIG SPRING, TEXAS 

AMberst 4-5341
399 Soatb First 

LAMESA, TEXAS

CHAMBLEE. Ga. (AP) -  A 
young Georgian who tried to 
rescue a 15-year-old girl being 
attacked by seven Negro thugs 
returned to the Philadelphia 
subway later to look for an en­
velope he’d dropped during the 
fight.

Richard George. 23, found his 
envelope. In it, now bloodied, 
were copies of the Declaration 
of Independence and the Consti­
tution.

“ It was my first trip north,” 
said George, a Navy Reserve 
airman and college senior.

“I’d Just visited Independence 
Hall. I’d bought the Declaration 

! of Independence and the Constl- 
i lution to bring back to m, 
young nephews in Atlanta.

ON GROUND
“I went back to the subway 

station jrfatform where the at 
tack occinred, and there the en 
velope was on the ground, all 
bloody.”

The slender airman was beat­
en by the thugs when he went 
to the aid of the white girl in 
early March. He still has a aoRW 
nose and a black eye.

George was on liberty durlni 
his two weeks traininE at WII 
low GrovB Naval Air Stetkm i t

size aau mee wmi maos •
■ " f i . ô ô x  13 s i e . o é

6 .5 0  x 13 9 8 . 3 8
7 .0 0  X 14 2 0 .1 0
7 . 5 0 x 1 4 / 6 . 7 0 x 1 5 2 1 .2 0

I  8 . 0 0 x 1 4 / 7 . 1 0 x 1 5 2 2 . 3 0
ÿ  8 . 5 0 x 1 4 / 7 . 6 0 x 1 5 2 8 . 8 0
X  8 . 2 0 x 1 5 2 8 . 8 0

*T»bolo«« bUckwall plu» u». i »•••NEWAUft MU-GMCCG, TgAi

EXTRA-MILEAGE 
TUFSYN RUBBER!
No Money Down I 
Fr«e Mounting I
"No Umii'*Qu«rMnUol

a iz s M U  m e t WITH T8AM •
5.00x13 • 1 8 .8 8
6.50x13 2 0 . 1 0
7.00 X 14 “ 2 2 . 1 8

♦ 7.50x14/6.70x15 M 9 M
é.ÔO X 14/7.10x15“ 2 8 . 8 8
8.50 X 14/ÿ.60 X 15“ 2 8 . 1 8
8.20 X 15 3 1 . 8 8

T̂ubolM* biackwall plu* l«x. kü

the time be saw the girl being 
attacked.

“ I heard her screaming.” said 
George. “ I saw the boys hold­
ing her on the platform. Then 
they started dragging her off 
with them. I yelled at some oth­
er fellows who were watching 
the attack, to help

NEGRO YELIJ»
“One of the Negroes then 

yelled, i>ook out, he’s going for 
help,’ ” George said.

“When I heard them say that. 
I went .straight in. They started 
beating me. I finally got away 
and ran to a cashier's office 
where they called the police, 
George said today.

“H& pants were half .om 
off,” his mother. ’*rs. Calvin 
George, said. 'T m  glad they 
didn’t have any knives. If they 
had. they'd probably have killed 
him.”

Seven of the Negro thugs 
have been sentenced to reform­
atories, five until they are 21, 
a maximum sentence. Two got 
indeterminate terms 

Told that as a result of the 
incident, the mayor of Philadel 
phia has ordered police dogs 
into the .subways to protect peo­
ple, George said he thought 
dogs would be “a  wonderful 
deterraBt'*

PBIÜEBBMK
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Silk For Sunday
i « t  n i l  that cata ta ekarck-la ctab~ar la 
Ito rttv «ttk cqaal anaraM « a llia  fscaO nt 
m i r .  il stoira al Ml. CqwM l-Uedt al Dal- 
m  u ü a n  lift M a a itople i t a i m m  al a 
aali wlili avefttaan. V&y kawai al Ito waW-

far a  dreaiauker tn ck . AI rigM, ■«¡•p*
pta »Wl»

fabric a l Araal a a i  callaa. Itoa adda fcnl- 
a m  rafflea a l arckUae aad cafla la m e a t a 
BBiqac ihtft arlth lallarad practicality 
**falr lady” ckam . T ie  faiblaa i war 
a l He T an a  P aah in  Crealara Aaaad ali n  

ta DaBas. (AP WllEPHOTO)
JcaalBci al Dallas barrava II

Larnesa Woman's Club 
Names Officer Slate
LAMESA (SC) -  Tba La- 

maaa Womaa'a Stady Chib mat 
raocoUy to deci offlcara lor 
I te  coaling yaar. Thon aamad 
were Mrs. .%naie Bailey, pra 
deal: Mrs. Jo in  Scott, first vice 
praaideBt; Mrs. L  D. Ecbola, 
aecond rice presideiit; Mrs. U ti
S i t e ,  tblrd «ica president; Mrs 
J . b  Janklas, reurding

P-TA Sees 
Math Film

tary; Mrs H. M. Bnmar, traaa-
arer; Mrs. Wade dvarsoa, par- 
liam ntariaa; Mrs. Praak Lid-

aaddell, fadaratkMi cotmaalor;
Mrs. 0 . H. Siras. reporter.

Mrs. Irena McDaniel, guest 
speakar, was Introdacad ^  the 
program chalrmaa, Mrs. w. K 
Crawlay. Mrs. McDaaial. de­
signar for Dotty Dans at La 
mesa, was aasistad by Mrs

Mrs. Bill Davis 
Tells ESA Duties

Dick Stapbens, aasisUnt daalgn- 
, la sbowing

W. A. Wilaoa 
of Coahonu schools, was guest 
speaker for the Coahoma Par- 
aot-Teachers Assodatloa Tborv 
day evening at the school. Mrs

er for the company 
Mme of the chUdren’s clothing 

manufacturad. They de- 
tha designing and con­

struction of the garments and 
espia inad bow they are m ar­
keted.

beiag
talM

B n  Skives Introduced t h e  candles 
speaker, '  " “  "  "
Craves

Mrs. J . D. Jenkin: was host­
ess for the meeting.

The refreshment table was 
covered with a green linen cloth 
centered with candy Easter e g p

p v a  the m ocatkm.
Sopt. WUson showed a film 

on modera math and held an

r dtacnaaloa oa Ita methods.
Skives, presideiit ol the 

P-TA. namad a  Bominatiag 
conunlttee to preaant  a  slate ol 
prospective officen at the next 
meeting. April U. Mrs. C. C. 
Harrison gave a  report oa the 
spring conference which was 
held a t Cosdea Country Club 
this month.

Refrashments were served by 
the executive committee to the 
a  inembars aad guests attend- 
tag.

Knott 4-H Members 
Complete Unit No. 1

Mrs. Bill Davis told the his­
tory aad duties of Epslloa Sig­
ma Alpha at the Thursday ave- 
aiag maeting of Alpha Chi Chap­
ter of the aororlty. Mrs. James 
Cook, Sand Springs, w u  host­
ess for the group.

Mrs. Frank Perry presidad at 
the short buslnen seasioa and 
the opening ritual.

E l ^  members aad tw o  
rushees, Mrs. Fred Overton and 
Mrs. BUI Daniel, were served 
refreshments from a lace cov­
ered table, accented with silver 
and milk glass.

Pins Presented 
By Alpha Chi's

Casually Yours
By JO BRIGHT

Every Sunday I sUcntly
Mr. and Mrs. Lee 0 . Rogers 
for thè flaeting beaety of 
shadowy silhouette their house 
and evergreens creata* agabut 
thè first raoments at mwBing.

On these days, my son, The 
Newspaper Boy, aad I team up 
and try to see that our 
bors bave somethlag to scan 
during thè kwgeat n

takes
coffee lo brew

Beiag a monuag person, my 
protest against the intrusion of

Kelton Gastons 
Announce Birth

FORSAN (SC)-M r. aad Mrs
Kelton Gaston b r o ^ t  their in 
fant son, Karltoa Wesesley, bom 
March IS, home this week. Pa­
ternalgrandparents a r t  Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifford Gaston of Sterling 
City and maternal grandpar­
ents arc Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Reschner of Paw Paw, Mich.

Tht Knott 4-H Club Cooldag 
Unit No. 1 completed the first 
series of the cooking course 
when they met Thursday in the 
home of Mrs. I.eoo Riddle. Sher 
ry Riddle and D e ^  WUliams 
prepared a meat lalad and ex-< 
plained the nutritive values of 
the ingredients.

Mrs. Joe Mack Gaikias, adult 
leader, was hostess for the Fri­
day meeting Knyla Gaakins and 
Sheree Shnw made drop biscuita 
and told the necessity of bread 
aad ccranl products for energy

Jewel end pM ga pins were
preeented to members of 
Alpha Chi Chapter of Epeilon 
Sigma Alpha sorority in n meet 
mg held at tha SpaiUab Inn Sat 
urday evening.

Mrs. Frank Perry, president, 
pr eeented pledge pins to Mrs 
BUI Daniel andM rs. Fred Over- 
ton, and Jewel pins to Mrs. 
Lloyd NaOa and Mrs. Robert 
Rogers.

Next meeting of the chapter 
wUl be in the home of Mrs. 
Bin Davis, im  Lancaster, 
April I.

five o’clock alarm is only a 
momentary annoyance. Mv 
partner, however, raaiata a  liu 
tie lo a m , dragging bis tennla- 
shoed n e t against keeping n 
rendezvous with the rising sun.

Yesterday it was pure plea­
sure. The Newspapn- Boy w u  
out of town so Rebecca and 

completed kla appointed 
rounds.

The chin w u  gone, aad the 
sun came up to sea tha air 
modestly draped like a moist 
lavender veU around tha crest 
of South Mountain.

Everyoot Kerned to be 
sleeping late except Mr. Cliff 
Wiley who, with broom in hand, 
w u  sloshing a  pail of watar 
acrou  the tide steps. Said he 
and Mrs. WUey were expect­
ing company to arrive in a lit­
tle whQe. Acrou the street, 
Mrs. Nina Carter's car w u  al­
ready gone, M I knew the w u  
doing her usual Sunday mora- 
iag choru  at the office.

^  Jack Y. Smith home w u  
silent and stffl, and I paused 
there to touch a solitary daffo- 
dU — to pretty It looked artl- 
fidal. Next door, a t tha Mer­
rill Crelghtoa’a, my eye w u  
caught by tha l i t t i ^  duck that 
resti oa their window le tte , and 
I remembered the b u u tim  Mal- 
lards that used to follow me 
around the barnyard when 
w u  a child In Louisiana.

Spring win be with u  even 
naore next Sunday. The paper 
route will surely provide u  
with the nicest hour of the day.

Two others who must have 
enjoyed the weekend were Mrs 
E. L  Powell and Mrs. Ty Al­
lan who, with Mrs. C. L. Bast 
and Mrs. C. B. B ry u t of Sweet 
water, took first overall in the 
Team of Four garou  at tha re­
gional bridge toonument Just 
ended la Lubbock. Heard they 
woo about S  rad points.

Mrs. M. R. Koger told me 
Kmethlng the other day that 
should Imierest people here who 
remember MaJ. and Mrs. WU- 
lard A. Mason, formerly of 
Webb. Their p r e ^  and talented 
daughters are now students at 
Mkidlebury College In Vermont 
where they are s tu d ^ g  lango- 
a g u . Kathy pledged Delta Delta 
Delta and Linda la with Kappa 
Kappa Gamma.

Mrs. T. B. Clifton Called and 
said she and her sister, Mrs. 
E. L. Patton returned Thurs­
day fium Yoakum where they 
attended funeral Krvices for 
their oldeet brother, Edwin Hil- 
bun. They were Joined there by

three other atatera and a broth-
er.

Other travelers were Mr. and 
Mrs. Vernon Kant who came 
home Sunday. They had picked 

hit brother and sister-in-law, 
. aad Mrs. J . W. Kent, of 

Graham, aad they all went to 
Electra to sm  their aunt and 
uncle, Mr. r rd  Mrs. JuUous 
Kent, who are 10 and f t  years 
of age. ’Thev stopped la Throck 
morion and Rlstiig Star before 
returning here.

The Joe Mosses are enjoying 
visit from her parents, Mr.

aad Mrs. F. D. ReeK of Ans- 
Ua, who plan to be here for 
at least a weak or k .

Dr. and Mrs. Arck Carson 
are back from D allu  where 
they attKided the Southern 
CUakal Medical meeting at the 
sutler-Hilton. She w u  planning 
to iMve again to visit her moth- 

Mrs. Lawrence Brown, but 
w u  not aurt she would get 
away y e t

Mrs. J . H. Eastham, I l ls  No­
lan, h u  a aew grandchild, Gary 
Bryan, to brag about Sha h u  
spent the p u T  month with the 
parsnU, her son, Doug, aad his 
wlfa, Phyllis, who live in Bay 
town. Mra. E u tham  drove 
around the NASA a m  and 
thought the country w u  beauti­
ful.

Things were pretty busy 
around our town Saturday 
evening. Noticed Mrs. Chester 
Matheny aad Mrs. Imogtoe 
Lloyd greeting guests a t the 
Easter Seel daace at Coeden 
Country ChH. Haviiu dtoner at 
the chib were the Louis Wolf- 
sons, tha Jeff Browns. MaJ. and 
Mrs. Chartes H. Pena. Capt. 
and Mrs. J . H. Siraoaton, and 
CoL aad Mrs. EdwU J . White 
Jr.

Saw others arotmd town — 
but that’s another column.

Jerry Matthews' To 
Make Baird Home

BUEUISnt
Cm h t , aUWUMTNV

in
■M ireiNe NAaowann

FORSAN (SC) -  Mrs. O. W. 
Scudday h u  bean in San An-

£lo for a few days with her 
u ^ te r  and (amily, Mr. aad 

Mrs. Jerry Matthews. Matthews 
is a  highway patrolman, and is 
being transferred to Baird.

Visitors in the home at Mr. 
aad Mrs. Gerald Washburn 
were Mr. and Mrs. Don Mills 
aad children from EliasvUle.

Visitors In the A. 0 Jones

Three Join 
Busy Bees
STANTON (SC) — New mem­

bers of the Busy Bee 4-H Qub, 
Janice Turner, Gerry Walker 
and Laura Costlow, were intro­
duced at a recent meeting in 
the home demonstration agent’s 
office. .

home were Mr. and Mrs. Har­
ley Gnmt and children, Jimmy, 
Gary aad Ricky of McCamey.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert New- 
oMBb of Hobbs, N. M., were 
gueets in the borne of her par­
ents, Mr. aad Mra. J . W. ¿rtf- 
fith.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy WUlis 
and daughter of Hobbs, N. M., 
were visitors in the home of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. S. J. 
Willis.

Visitors in the R. D. Ander­
son home la Ackerly were Mr. 
and Mrs. Burl Griffith, Mr. and 
Mrs. John B. Anderson and 
Nancy and Mrs. Betty Ander­
son.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Griffith 
and Jeff are Uvinf In McCam- 
ey havtag returned from u  18 
month’s itay  in Gabuti, India. 
She is the (laughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. J . D. Gilmore, and his 
parents are Mr. aad Mra. J . W. 
Griffith.

Margaret ’Turner w u  appoint­
ed to fin the unexplred term (if 
the ptiaident. E liabeth  Ward, 
who h u  moved. Gerry Walker 
w u  elected vice preaideot.

The group h u  completed Unit 
One on reem tioa , and will ita rt 
a new unit on food at the Thurs­
day meeting. Mrs. Mildred £ i 
land, h 0 m a demonstration 
agent, attendctL

MRS. D. J. KINARD 
Has Retnracd Ta 

larva Hcr Castauers
AT

FRANKLINS
SM MAIN

Soy
. . .  Happy Easter
w i th

CARPET
from

THE
CARPET
STORE

“Where You Buy 
Quality For .Leas"

G U A R A N T I E D

Installation

No Money Down 
Take Months To Pay

DUl AM S4611
1307 GREGG

Summer Slacks 
Accent Waist
Designara found that thare 

w u  room a t the top when they 
styled the new slacks tor ipring 
aad summar 1M6. A g m t  d u i  
at attention h u  been paid to 
waistband and pocket details. 

Soma slacks c(mw witk their 
vn belts — Km e matching, 

others In smartly contrasting 
solids and stripu . Othars entail 
the wanted g(>If slack details— 
big pockets, big comfort, big 
style!

Some of the new Macks are 
made with walatbands that look 
like belts. Western-typa pockets, 
polo pockets. Lrshaped pockets, 
new Klf-supporting fu tu res 
new fabrics and (to d e fu t tboM 
humid days ahead) permanent 
preu .

McCamey Visiteid
FORSAN (SC)-Cathie Griffith 

visited recently In McCamey 
with her parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Griffith, aad broth­
er, Jeff.

Their s tu ÿ  was climaxed at 
r Favorite Food Showthe county 

held Saturday in the First Meth 
odist Church.

Collegians Visit
FORSAN (SC)—Bcttye Conger 

and Bill Stockstill, students at
San Angelo Junior College are 
visiting in the homes or their
parents.

Coahomans Welcome
Weekend Visitors

COAHOMA (SC) -  Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Garrett and son of 
Midland were weekend guests 
of his parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Garrett.

Mr. and Mrs. Ruben McCowan 
and (laughters, Pam and An­
gela. of Rising Star were guests 
of their parents the past week­
end.

Grady Collins of Sand Springs 
has been released from the hos-

Eital and is recuperating at 
ome.
Mrs. Tommy Parrish is a pa­

tient at the Cowper Clinic and 
Hospital.

Mrs. W. A. Wils(«n and Mrs. 
V. R. Hinsiey spent the weekend 
in Merkel with Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Zitterkoff and Brent.

Visiting hera Tuesday w u  
Mrs. Johnny Adams of Colorado
City. Mrs. Adams spent the diy 
with her daughter, Mrs. Pat
Shields.

George Clark stationed with 
the Navy in Jacksonville, Fla., 
is visiting here with his wife.

Tracy Dyku, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Chartes Dyku, is a
patient at the Malone and Ho­
gan Foundation Hospital.

Mrs. Gladys Bryant spent the 
weekend in Dallas visiting with 
her sons. Dr. Milton Bryant and 
Claude Bryant. Both sons cele­
brated their birthdays Sunday.

Mr. Albert Becker, 95, of Sand 
Springs is a surgery patient at 
the Cowper Clinic and Hospital.

MEN need to find the TRUTH
Not because IT Is Lost, to t tocauM THEY are Lost

GOSPEL MEETING
AriUL 4-M , l««S 

Hear GLEN PACE at Soarey, Ark.
SpaaUag Each NIgM at 7:1 

Mora lag—l• :• lIoralag-1
Curl Sfruuf Church of Christ 

2m Carl Street Big Sprtag. Texu

Y O U R  F R I E N D L Y FOOD
CENTER

Wu Oivu Scettiu Stumpu—Doublu On Wud. With $2.50 Purchuau Or Mora 
OPEN SUNDAYS 9 AM. TO 6 P M  

501 W. 3rd DWAIN HENSON AND BILLY COGGIN, OWNERS AM 3-6IS6

EGGS I Coke Mlx;S?Sf^«3 for »1.00 
j Cake Frosting 3.»1.00
I Peaches ÏÎ* ......4 for 89*

I 2  doz. 79* i Coektoil ......  19*
• “  Æ ^  KInIwiI 6 9 ^

McButh, Largu 
Cagad

:  C o f f e e.  V i iO T T e e  AU Griads, Lh. o o o o o o a o o o o o o a t o a o a

! Omelets ! Chili BeansI *“  j j i j j
......... 49*1 U, „ c  ....45*| I 7 for »1.00 j

CUT GREEN BEANS & POTATOES Kimben 7-»l'
Ctoc., V u ina , Strawberry, Lemaa

2 for 21*:
2 for 45*WHIP - N - CHILL

JELL-0 AJ ru v m . Wh. r t f .  — ----- --------  C D / \  W  A  k l  •

BUTTERMILK J ÏS ’c««... 39* | F R O jiA N  |
FLOUR 49*:w.o...
TISSUE ■ Carton 3-n.ooi

Best Vaioe

%-Lb

.... 4 rolls 29* [_________________
c o r n e s -» ' c ö r n '’'m ^̂^

29* EST* 7-»1.00 29*
Potatoes 69*S-Lh. Bag

Onions 1^  5*
10*Bananas ESru ... 

Oranges S“.... 12'/a*
Coca-Cola Ór Dr. Pepper SSS“.....................39*
Frozen Orange Juice Î5ITÜ........................  19*IIVEP ru ." 1 98*

i  STEAK r  39*
I T  ROAST ÎÎ*..............39*

Porlo Froah

Lb.

I
ir" I

revival
services

/ / Pointing The Way To 
Abundant Living . . . 

And Eternal Life"

Now Through April 4
DR. ROT McCLUNG 

Prcildaat 
Waylaai CaBega

REMVAL PREACHER

SUNDAY: 11 A M  WEEKDAYS: 7:00 A M  
7 P M  7:30 PAL

First Baptist Church
Sixth At Main

/ /
R. F. Polk, Paator

A Center Of Christian Faith And Action"

DONT MISS THE BOAT
USE THE BIG SPRING HERALD CLASSIFIED  

ADS AND BOOST YOUR PROFIT
When you use action-getting HERALD Classifled Ads you’re send­

ing your sales message to your very best prospect—the people who have 
already decided to buy! That’s why more and more smart, progressive 
busineues are putting their advertising dollars into this easy affordable 
medium. They know Classified gives them a unique advantage—it’s the only 
advertising that prospects voluntarily seek out! The people who tu rn  to 
the Classified pages have already decided to buy, and are looking to de­
cide "where” and "from whom.”

Decide today to set your course for increased sales and p ro fit Just 
dial AM 4-4331 between 8 a.m. and 5:30 p.m. for an experienced account 
representative who will give you information on the low commercial rate«.

Dial AM 44331

Big Spring Daily Herald
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Dear Abby

Ü

Glass Worker 
Strike Settled

Whtn It Th# 
Tim# To Toll

DEAR ABBY: I havt been 
reading your column ever aince 
I can remember, end now I 
am a freshman at Cohunbia Un­
iversity. When I was la high 
school I recall having read 
somethiaf la your cedumn about 
students who “ratted" on one 
another, and how you felt about 
tattleUlee. It made more aenae 
to m» than anything I have 
ever reed on that sub)ect. If 
you can locate that letter, please 
print It again. These are Umee 
when the question of “Inform­
ing” oo daaamatea who cheat 
la Umaly. Thank you.

DAVID AT COLUMBIA
DEAR DAVID: With the help 

el an efficient secretary. 1 la- 
rated the letter. It was firet 
printed an Nev. 14, INI, and 
here R la:

• •  •
“ DEAR ABBY: In our c lan  

at school we got Into a big dia- 
cussloa about “tattUng" and we 
would Uka to know how you 
feM about UUs subject Thank

^ ’high school students
DEAR STUDENTS: Per aeaw 

reaasa. leochcrt, and even par

ATLANTIC CITY (AP) -  
Union leaden accepted a new 
three-year contract Sunday 

ending an 11-day strike 
uch idled I s  per cent of the 

nation’s glasa container indus­
try.

A ipokesman for the G ian 
BotUa Blowers Aasodatlon said 
telegrama were being aent to all

union locals advising them to 
return to work as aocn aa possi­
ble Some S2.0M unioa members 
atnick March 11 and I,MO other 
workan were idled by the 
strike.

BACK TO WORK
A apokeamaa for tha Glass 

Container M anufactaren Instl 
tute, which repranots I t  oo»-

lain , said aoma of tha M 
struck planu could résuma op- 
eratlQoa tonight.

Thn contract offar was ap­
proved by a committee of N  lo­
cal union leaden. RatWcatloa 
la not required by the memben

Lee Minton, unkm pcesldent 
termed the contract "the beat 
ever negotiated la the gU n  
coaUlnn' Industry." The con 
tract provldn for n pnekagn la 
c renn  of cents aa 
the unioa estimates.

R cnlla for hourly wage In­
creases of 10 cants tha first 
year, four cents tha second and 
I t  ccau tha third.

Thn current avernfn hourly

wags la the tadnatry is N  N  
OTBKB TERMS

Other te rn s  IneUide:
—A Jotntly ndnstnistered r»- 

Ursment fund to which enploy- 
ers will contributed cents an 
hour for madlcaL life and hos­
pital insurance for rstirad work 
a n  and their spouses.

—A d a u n  under which aa 
enqiloye at lenat 40 yean  old 
with.IS yean  of asrvice. If laid 
off dua to a plant shutdown 
cortnilmeat or sutomatlott, can 
move to anothor asanufacturer 
and retain full peasioa cradltn

U.S. Weapons 
For Thailand
BANGKOK, Thailand (AP) -  

The United States will SMlat 
Thailand In establishing a new 
type of police force la nortbnnst 
Thnllaad to help count* Com­
munist Insurgency, the Thai 
governmeat announced today.

Deputy Premier PraNWS 
durusathlen  said tha Unllad 
Sutas will provldt weapona, 
equlpoMat and technical naMat-

Big Spring (Tnxon) H nrald, M en ., M ercb 29 , 1965 5-A

Chiooif Wonts On 
Rod Nuckor Goob
TAIPEI. Formosa (AF) »  

Chlaag Knl-slMk. CWnaae Na-

ttoaalM preaidsat. said todnp 
Iba anelear weapona which thn 
Ch tarns Comnnahtt are try taf 
to develop are “henrOsasly 1» 
tended for thn dnstruction of 
mnnklBd"

ProtcripHon By
OHÔNC AM À S 15S  

OOO MAIN 
WO O P n iN a  TEXAS
DELIVERY AT NO EXTRA CHARGE

Soü/voÈ

Safeway’ s Baby Beef Sale
Chuck Roast
Safeway Meat Special. • • 
Tender and Economical 
Baby Beef. Serve with 
potatoes and carrots.

(Crown Roast —cb.SRi

EARLY WEEK BUVS ]
Post Cereals

> 1
Beef Stew

i f  UdR Brow IA«. tm 
A Bree I  PiBM I
if Sonar Sporidi

Austex
24-oz.Can

Is
gmeefwl for one child to tell 
samcene In nnthwity that naeth- 
er chM has disebeyed. uùsh^ 
haved s r  even hrokrn the Inw 
Is 11 nay wonder we have heed- 
laan and vandali who count H 
a vlrtna la t  to “aqneaT?

ThlB la nat to he cenfasrd 
wtih naning  to M anu m  Uw|
trnrher with. •'Johaay Ml m e!"' 
U children are to grow np wtth 
a leane ef dvfc dnty, they can 
a  senae of civic dnty, they can- 
net he tanghi that It la “nn- 
Me” to remain silent when they 
knew who kas destroyed public 
property or committed other 
se rto «  antleectal nets. (It is 
thehr parents who mast pay for 
saeh deeds.) Abe. it Is « fa ir  
that a gniltv chM shanM “get 
hy" napnnished; the next time 
he will try snmethlag a Utile 
bolder. I think K’s time we 
adalis reviewed ear altitade m  
“tattling."

# • to
DEAR ABBY: la it Impolite 

to ask for a recipe? A friend 
of miM recently attended a din­
ner party (all friends) and 
asked the boste« for her recipe 
for a dessert which she fiund 
delicious The hostess replied. 
“ I never give out my re d p «  "

Was the hostess right in re­
fusing? Or was my friend 
wrong tor nsking?

JUST CURIOUS]
DEAR JUST: It In net “ fan 

ponte " to ask for a recipr. Most 
cooks are compUmented when 
their gaests hiqalre. These who 
refnac to give out their recipes 
(infessienal chefs exrepted) 
are selfish. After nO. hat for 
the generosity of o th e ^  THEY 
would not have a coDcctlM of 
r e d p «  themselv«.to to to

Troubled? Write to ABBY, Box 
W700, Los Angeles. CnMf. For 
a personal reply, enclo« a 
stamped, self-addieased « v e  
lope. •  •  •

For Abby’s booklet. “How To 
Have A Lovely Wedding," send 
50 c « ts  to Abby, Box 50700, 
Los Angeles. Cnllf.

Show Is Child 
Of Radio Htt

By CYNTHIA LOWRY
AC TV • a « *  Wrttw

NEW YORK (AP) -  It was 
about 30 years ago that “ Major 
Bowes’ Amateur Hour,’’ Jurt s 
local radio p ro p tm  on New 
York City’s WHN became a 
Thursday night network p r^  
gram — and promptly turned 
into a national rage.

CBS’ “O r i g i n a l  Amateur 
Hour," with Ted Mack as .hMt. 
is the legitimate television child 
of the old Bowes radio snow. 
Sunday night it devoted Its time 
to an anniversary salute to the 
time - honored entertainment

^^Blts of old newsreel film 
showed us a few hapless con­
testants whose show biz carceR 
fortunately were nipped m w  
bud There was also s recording 
of the radio debut of “The Ho-1 
boken Four,” o n e  of whose 
members, named Frank Sma- 
tra, went on to other p a s t* « .

Over the years, narrator hm  
Cochran said. Bowes’ staff and ■ 
tioned almost a million acta all 
over the country to p res« t 
about 18.000 on the air. At one 
time the radio show 
ing of 44.7 — meaning that «-

half the radio
nation were tuned to the pro-

*T he second half of the salute 
to amateur shows wiU be s« n  
next Stmdav and if k contains 
material half «  “
the fln t one. it to wen worth a
look.

i=KX" Arni Roast Bnby Bnnf.
Juicy end Tnnd«^—Lb.

t o -

Chuck Steak
Rib Chops 
Short Ribs

Economicel Buy—Lb. 

Beby B««f.
Sorve Pan Fried— Lb.

O r Brisket
Beby Beef—4i>.

MORE MEAT BUYS
Bologna 
Fish 
Halibut Steaks

Jumbe. Repvler or Thick 
Sliced. 14-es. fke.—Lb.

Jumbo
Pre-Ceeked—Lb.

Barbecue Sauce
Rad Bryant Smokahouito.

6^  Bottle

Northern Tissue
2-7&Toilet. White end 

Assorted Colors.
4-Roll Pkg.

GOOD BUYS
Admiretioe Requier Gfted.

L u O r te e  (6« off lebri)—1-Lb. C«n / V f

Coffee 85t
Cortfifi . (»• oeubuii-4-««.j*f_  /yciia « ,.j* ,(JO *o ffto b *i)-4 ij* i *

Cremoro lordent—4-oc. Jsr 29« 
Peanut Butter 3!t99i 
Coffee Cake s.r.i..-itM. 79t 
Pound Cake ‘•'’M ."'’"- 79* 
Toilet Tissue 2!i 29<
Waffle Syrup 53«
Olive Oil Pompeisit—4-et. Cee 99* 
Dental Cream 63<

SPECIAL VALUES

Margarine 
Family

Coldbrook (Solid). 
I-Lb. PItg.

Harvest Blossom.

Gerber Strained 
Fruits and Vegetables. 

4V2-OZ. Jar 6>»59̂
Cake Mixes 
Pinto Beans

PiUtbury. Delui« Checolste, 
PinMpple, Sw<u ityU Chocolate, 
White, end Yellow—Req. loeei(Frosting Mix *¿;?K43>)

Town House

REAL VALUES 
Sugarine
Ideel for weiqbHwtoheie—d-eB. leftke.

Macaroni
fVeeec Cut . Far a  feud «toarota lO-o«. I

Lemon Juice
pUeo«w8Med)—-IH-«. PteeBs Squeese Settle 1 5 <

Raisin Bran
SItoeaf.i aaitypeaked h *aatfcri If-« , lea

HOUSEHOLD NEEDS
Kleenex 97*
Kotex 39«
Pine Oil “ttiaSr 39«

■frozen Food Buys'
Fantail Shrimp cg^
Cepteie’i Choice—I O-o«. Pkq. SwSw

Perch Fillet$9..QC4
Ceptein’s Choiem—1-Lb. Pkq. Mi EmRIw

Fishcakes o .T O i
Ceptein’s Choieo—12-«*. Pkq. ■■ ■ wF

OrangeJuiceo.gii
Bel-eÎ —12-oz. Cen ■■ wmEr

Coffee Rich
Perfect for your coffee—16-ei. Cte.

SAFEWAY FRESH PRODUCE

Fresh, Solid Headi.
Serve with Corned Beef— Lb.

Oranges Valencia.

••ea
Collard Greens 2-19«

New Potatoes
Serve in many vreyi. E r Broccoli with cho 

SeiKo—lS .

Wednesday is DOUBLE 
G O L D  BOND S T A M P  

Day at Safeway!
(Will» the (•«rclio*. •< IJ SO ar Mar. )

BAKERY FEATURE
Petite Sliced Breed

FOR BABY
Heinz Cereal PfU-cooliod 4 M. Im 19< 
Juice Orauqt.

AppleSauce,i<«̂ *t:n,6«*' 59« 
DAIRY FEATURE

f

Buttermilk

DENTAL CARE
Toothbrush faptodant M#di«(u 

(20« off latol)

! - 19< Fresh Pineapple 39f
2IH Romaine 2<-»39^

ORAL HYGIENE
49r Toothpaste wi—iwi.b. 29f
99* Toothpaste 49*
49* Toothpaste «.-«t (a *

Skylark 
1-Lb. Loaf

ï f ' - i  ■) If Lucerne 
W-GaL C rt

Prices Effective M « ., Tum . and Wed., March N, N  and SI, In Big Spring. 
We ReMrve the R lg^ to U n it  (^uaattttw. No Satoe to Deaton.

S A F E W A Y

f !

W
■-.ii11. /

■ / 1 \4. \
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Hart M ay Continue
O n Pro-Golf Tour
Wins Playoff

Even When 
Wilt's Cold, 
76ersWin

Duel Sunday
WILMINGTON, N C. (AP) -  

The D k t Hari golfing family, 
Its beak roll enriched by IS.IM, 
piled Into a trailer today wth Its 
destination uncertain.

Hart, a 2S-ycar-o)d chib pro­
fessional from Hinsdale. Ill , 
had intended to head back to his 
club )ob after finishiag his sixth 
winter golf tour. But winning 
the A zalu Open Tournament is 
an eight-hole sudden-death play­
off Sunday with Phil Rodgers 
may c h a i^  things.

Hart, who has been a pro for 
II  ynars, entered the |tt.lll 
Greater (ireensboro, N.C., Open 
Tournament which starts Thurs­
day, after he outlasted Rodgers 
la tte tr  marathon duel

He sad his wife have two chil- 
drea.

Hart has played the last six 
winter tours, with his goal to 
win about IS.MI a year to meet
ttXp6Bt6S.

be  came here a bit Miy of that 
figure, having won tZ.tlS since 
louiiag the tour at Lss Angeles 
in January. But he won |S .m  
by bcatiag Rodgers, and his 
fourth-round M was worth |M  
la bonus money for the day’s 
low round He sad BUI Martia- 
daJs. who also had a M, snared 
the special I M J a c k ^

Hart won f l.lH  earlier ia bo­
nus money after a second-round 
K  over the l,7M-yard par 72 
Cape Fear CouiRry Oab course 
Rodgers won |2,MI rauMr-up 
money.

Hart and Rodgers shot 271, a 
doxn strokes under par In tying 
after 72 holes. Joe Campbell, 
third at 271. won I1J7S.

WtLMINCTON. N C (Aei • .  Mm «v 
la la* V JM  A m m  Opaa CaN

CINCINNA'n (AP) -  
Philadelphia Tiers do not neces­
sarily need prolific scoring from 
Wilt Chsmberlsin. Neithm- does 
the so-called disadvantage of 
f ila ^ g  on an opponent’s door 
M her them.

The 7-foot-l 
scored just 17 points Sunday 
but still led his team to an Im- 
pressive 108-M victory over the 
Cincinnati Royals 'n their semi
final playoffs in the National 
Basketball Asaodatk»

The victory gave Philadelphia 
a M  edge in the best-of-S East­
ern Division series. The fourth
game will be played in PhUadel-

Sia Wcdneeday night and the 
irs can wrap up the series

with a victory. Both of PhUadel 
phla's victories, 
been here.

however, have

Baltimore also needs only one 
more victory to win the best-of- 

Western Division semlflnals 
from the St. Louis Hawks. The 
BuUets moved into a M  edge 
with a crushing 121-M victory 
over the Hawks at Baltimore 
Saturday night The BuUets- 
Hawks fourth game wUl be 
Tuesday night In Baltimore.

Double Drop
When Dirk l a r t  dreppcd a 

ly at the Azalea Open
ie putt en the lath 

In WUmlnglM, N.C^ he let hli
The Big firing  Steen face a 

long week of bast
In a g t e f e  ef relief. The ihet 

lied with PhH Redgers, then 
Hidden death pinyeff before l a r t

hairi ef
(AP WIREPflOTO)

baseball heginniiig 
at 4 p.m. Tuesday when they 
take on the Lubbock Monterey 
Plainsmen at Staer Park.

ok

W M i HARDY PRICI I

DON ZIMMER

opening

iC c a  Man. »V turn..
t l  J7S

WH ManiiWaii. i i .4 a  
•uM* SatrS. t* .4»  . . .KZHwaenaa". tl.4e 

Baiai w. t i . a a  .. 
o w ra i  eaiMr. m i l  . 

HaraU Kmaca. t l « l  
Claaat Kiaa. tiJM  . . .  
l* r a w  Marra Jr., WM 
O ar, an

a-joa-jo-ps
asTvio 70-01 aa-MvsT-œ7>a-7o-x>-ein-tsf-n 70-03 
T»-n-7i n —CMn-7»7S7»_n4

>7»-Ä«•■7)7}.
ai-71.74.7V-OS aon-TS 74-OS
TMÏ-71 7 S - »  
^  7 4 -0 5a « ...........T s n a -  „

Sl4a KMaM. «MS ..............  «547 7S7D-t3ft
C)*M »raOTi. was ..............  TS-Ti-^TO-OS
l a r r ,  «ara. WaS ..............  n714Ì-74-t}S
SM»4 awa. tSM ................ 71-70-74-7S_r
p aaa  S a rc  tSM ................ S»«.7lV7)-{
baa* ewaMraal«. UM . . . .  S»0»-7».;<

Champs Are 
Both Favored
NEW YORK (AP) -  Chernpi- 

ons WUUe Pastrano, who once 
flunked gym. and EmUe Grif­
fith. who once made ladies’ hats 
for a living, are favored to de-
fend their titles against a couple 

lys named Joe on Tuealayof
night in a Madison Square Gar­
den championship doublehead­
er

Pastrano, the light • heavy

Oldest Mark May 
Topple In Relays

Thunday, Friday and Satnr- 
find the Steen in the

AUSTIN (A P )-ane  of the 
oldest recoftls on Uie books in 
Uie high school division of the 
Texas Relays is in danger as 
hundreds of schoolboys con­
verge on Memorial S ta ^ m  for 
the 38th annual meet Friday 
and Saturday.

Jourdanton's Barry Noble will 
be shooting Friday night at the 
rdays’ If-year-old jump 
record of e-3 set by Vern Me 
Grew of Houston Lamar.

Npble. who has won the 1K3 
and 1984 Oass A state champí 
onship, cleared 8 4 ^  two weeks 
•go.

Durable records in the other 
three Individual events appear 
to be safe again this year, in- 
chiding a 9 8 mark In the IM 
yard dash set in 1944 by Charles 
Parker of San Antonio Jeffer 
son.

Midland's versatile Ross 
Montgomery ha.s the best time 
of the group with a 98 wind 
aided c a k in g  L. J. Cohen of 
Corpus Christi Ray has turned 
in a 97. San Jacinto quarter 
miler Conley Brown has turned

weight champ from Miami, is a|in a 21.5 in his first 220-y.rd 
thui 8-5 favorite over Jose dash effort and could be a chal-
Torres of New York. Griffith, a 
native of the Virgin Islands now 
living in New Y c^ . is a solid 2- 
1 choice to defend his welter
weight crown again.st Jose Sta 
ble, a Cuban refugee now living 
in New York.

Each fight is scheduled for 15 
rounds, frith the Griffith-Stable 
bout going on first, at 9:30 p m .  
EST. The light-heavy fight will 
follow Immediately.

Oldham Letters 
At Arlington

ARLINGTON — Jim Oldham, 
8-5 former HCJC Jayhawk bas­
ketball player, was one of 10 
lx)ys who lettered at Arlington 
State for the 1904-65 .sea.son.

A Lubbock High product. Old­
ham ranked sixth in scoring for 
the Rebels with 130 points for 
a 5.4 average. He was the num­
ber three rebounder with 111 for 
a 4 6 average. A leg injury held 
him back in his last 10 games 

Oldham played for the Jay- 
hawks during the 1962-63 and 
1963-84 campaigns.

Co-lenger to Montgomery and 
hen Other top sprinters are 

:alliAustin McCailum's Richard

Lee'sWeir (22 8) and Houstou 
Mike McKee (217).

Pat Studdert of Howitoa San 
Jacinto. David Cote of Pasadena 
and liSe Hkrk.s of Corpus (Tiristi 
Miller head the IZAyard high 
hurdles field which wlU have a
hard time approaching the 14.1 
relays record set by Johnny 
Morrtss of Houstou Jones tast
year. Studdert has the best time 
of 14.8 white Cote and Hicks 
have run 14 7.

Top entry in the shot put is 
Copperas Cave's Ronnie Ught 
foot, who has put the shot C8- 
1^, the best of 1985 for scteml 
boys. Toby Belt of Houston 
Westbury set the relays’ shot 
put record of 80•9^ bi 1983. An 
other Westbury shotputter, Ruv 
ty Clark, has a S7414 effort and 
Montgomery of Midland has a 
58-5^ put.

Champ Grapplers
LARAMIE. Wyo. (AP) -  

Iowa State, for many years the 
bridesmaid of NCAA wrestling, 
cast aside the runner-up role 
and ousted defending champion 
Oklahoma State 87-88 to win the 
1965 national collegiate wres­
tling title Saturday night.

Amazing Mustangs Are 
Sitting On Top Of Heap

a ,  TIW Am m MM« Pr«44

The amazing Southern Meth 
odi.st Mustangs, who aren’t sup­
posed to be on top In the South- 
we.st Conference baseball race 
but are sitting up there with 
aplomb, fac'e a tough week.

The Methodists play three 
conference games, two of them 
again.st the always contending 
Texas Ianghom.s.

SMU took over the undi.sputed 
lead last week and remained 
unbeaten in conference play by 
rapping Texas A&M 74 and 
Baylor 7-5. If it's the mark of a 
champion to take the close ones, 
SMU measures up.

day battle dangerous Texas at 
Dallas.

The week is filled with crucial

i;ames Baylor and Texas, tied 
or .second place, a game back 

of SMU, get together at Austin 
Wednesday.

Friday and Saturday Texas 
and SMU head up a bristling 
schedule that has all the teams 
in conference action. Baylor and 
Texas Christian meet at Fort 
Worth and Texas AlcM and 
Rice cla.sh at Houston.

Baylor plays Missouri in an 
intersectional game at Waco to­
day while Texas A&M visits 
University of Houston.

Baylor and Missouri play
Tuesday they play a make-up again Tuesday. Those are the 

game with Texas Chri.stian at only non-conference games on 
Dallas. And Friday and Satur |the week’s schedule.

American Cars Shut Out
Europe's Best At Sebring
SEBRING, Fla. (AP) -  The 

old adage, “ If you can’t beat 
'em, join ’em,’’ probably applie.s 
to automobile racing more than 
any other field.

Jim  Hall's spectacular victory 
here Saturday in the 12-houir 
endurance race, using a Chevro­
let-powered car with an auto­
matic transmission, probably 
will set the pace for the sport 

“You can’t knock success,” 
Mid a spokesman for Carroll 
Shelby, builders of the Ford-Co­
bra and now in charge of the 
Ford GT racing program.

“We’ve been working on an 
automatic transmi.ssion princi­
pal aa well as other t h h ^ ,“ 
aald a repnaentative for Snel- 
by-Amcrtcan of Venice, Calif. 

“Hie autooutic tranamJaslMi

probably is thè coming thing in 
iritemational road racing com­
petition."

Hall’s Chaparral — which is a 
term for the road ninner bird in 
Texas, Hall’s home state — fin­
ished the 12-hour grind over the 
5.2 mile twisting course with 197 
laps, five laps ahead of the rest 
of the field His average speed 
for the 12 hours was 84.723 miles 
per hour

Rain which started falling in a 
jnd 4:38torrential downpour aroui 

p m.. Big Spring time, slowed 
his earlier pace of just under 
100 miles per hour, e l^ t  m.p.h. 
more than the record set last 
year by a Ferrari.

Hall raced la the sports car 
category.

The second place car, a  Fonl,

prototype, driven by Ken Miles 
of Hollywood, Calif., and Bruce 
McLaren of New Zealand fin­
ished second at 192 laps and 
won the points toward the 
world’s manufacturers title. A 
Ford-Cobra, produced by Shel­
by, won the m n d  touring divi­
sion title with a fourth-place 
finish at 187 Is m . The third 
place car was a Ferrari driven 
by David Piper of England and 
Anthony Maggs of Pretoria, 
South Africa.

The American built cars coin- 
tries — for the first time in four
years.

This was the second time in 
less than a month that the Ford 
prototypes beat Ferrari In the 
race for the manuiacturers 
championship. . .

day wiU 
Eunice, N.M., besebaU h a n a -  
meot. Eight teams a r t  entered 
In the three^ay meet.

Coachee Boy Baird aad Tom 
King hava not decided who will 
start on the mound for the 
Steen la Tnaaday’s gams, but it 
could be Freddie Mtean. Baird 
said they would have to figure 
out the pitching ‘or the entire 
week before naming a Tuesday 
starter. All pitchen, however, 
are ready.

Big Spring will start the tour­
nament Hnnaday at 1:15 p.m 
(MST) agatnet Kermit. Mona 
hana and host Eunice play in 
the second game Thunday at 
8:15 p.m. Friday’s action will 
see Portatea, N. M., taking on 
Lovington. N. M., at 8:15 p.m 
and Andrews vt. Snyder at 1:15 
p.m. The championship game 
will be played at 8:15 p m. Sat­
urday. Times are Mountain 
Standard Time.

It seems that not everybody 
Is happy with the name of the 
Houston baseball club, the As­
tros. A lot of people have talked 
of bow the name doeeat quite 
sound Just right, but few have 
done anything about ft 

One who hat done 
about It la the Rev. R 
McAfee, pastor of St. John the 
Divine Episcopal Church in 
Houston. Ia a recent 'tetter to 
sportwriten throughout Texas, 
Bev. McAfee has appaated for 
aid for hlf cause. His opei 
paragraph follows:

“ LMe ether lexane, Heaa- 
tanteas are a prend tet, aad 
we seed y e v  help! Ever 
atece the asam af Henrtea 
Baseball was chaaged freai 
’CaM .4St’ te ‘Aalras.' we 
renfteaely have heard each 
pkraats aa: AMre-Nats, As- 
Ire-Nanghts, Astre-Nes, As- 
tre-Nets and ether teas deli­
cate cenihteatteei each as 
the ene appited te the Aau- 
liOe farm clab — th e  haM- 
Asteae.*
Now It doesn’t  take too much

Imaglnatloo to figure out what 
would c

Score Doubtful
Confusion

BV TIm An m M M  Vr«M

When does e batter hit a home 
run with two men on base, and 
only one run scores?

When does a batter hit a home 
run with two men on base, and 
only two runs score?

In the first instance, when 
Kansas City’s Tom Reynolds 
slammed an apparent homer in 
the 10th inning with the game 
tied 8-8 Sunday,. The hit gave 
the Athletics a 9-8 victory ov 
St. Louis.

and wai passed by Williams, 
who was called out and credited 
with a single. Beckert trotted 
home from third, and first-base 
umpire Ed RunK waved Clem­
ens around the bases for a sec­
ond run.

In less • confusing exhibition 
baseball games Sunday, Fred

In the second instance, when 
Billy Williams of the Chicago 
Cubis socked an apparent hamer 
in the seventh inning that 
snapped a 5-5 tie last Wednes­
day. 'The Cubs evcntuallv edged 
the Los Angeles Angels 8-7.

To say the situatioiu are coa 
fusing is an understatement. In 
fact, Sunday's incident was so 
confusing that the final acore at 
first was determined to be 184 
It was only after a long diaeu»* 
sioo that the score wm  changed 
to 94.

With one out and the score 84 
in the 10th inning, Ed Charles 
w u  at second and Ken Suarez
was at ftrit. Reynolds rapped

•field

come over the air If an 
excited sportacaster were to{ 
flub that “ less delicate com-| 
binatlon '* !

Rev. McAfee suggests that we 
call Houston b a s ^ U  the, and
here It Is — “ Lunar Ticks."

• • •
He goes oa to say, "One of 

the two sportrasters, a rather 
rustic individual, for three years 
has worked toward establishing 
a trademark in this neck of 
the woods. During thoM three 
loog years he has Insisted oo 
screaming into the mike, “ Now 

chunkin' in there, Colt .45s “ 
seems to me that he might

the ball toward the right 
fence and started running 

Charles and Suarez started 
ninning. too, but then held up 
when it appeared that the Car­
dinals’ Tito Francooa might 
catch the ball. Reynolds dldnl 
slow up, though, and was I I  feet 
past Suarez by the time the ball 
skimmed over the faoce.

After Charles aad Suarez both 
crossed the plate, plate umpire 
.Nestor Cbyiak stgnated two 
runs. Thars whea the final 
score was given as 184 It !‘‘tar 
was changed under a provlsioa 
of rule 4.uc:

"The batter hits a home run 
out of the playing field to win 
the game la the last half of the 
ninth or aa extra inning, but is 
called out for passing a preced­
ing ninner. The n m e  ends im­
mediately when the winning run 
is scored ”

In the Wednesday instance, 
the Cubs and Angels were tied 
54 with none out in the fifth. 
With Glenn Beckert at third and 
Doug Clemens at first, WUlums 
hit his second homer of the 
game over the right • field 
screen

Here, too, Clemens held up

squad while another Cleveland 
team beat Boston 54 behind 
Leon Wagner’s two-run homer.

The Chicago White Sox de­
feated Detroit 54, Cincinnati 
beat the New York Yankees

Newman pitched the A n ^  to a 
Cleveland5-3 victory over one

4-2. MlnnesoU nipped the Los 
74. IAngeles Dodgers 74. Baltimore 

eàkà  Pittsburgh 44. the New 
York Meta downed Milwaukee 
8-2 and the Cubs trounced San 
Francisco 114.

- ^

-

Baker Ruris Fourth In Hurdles
Big Spring’s Babby Baker boraU aereas the ftalsk line Sat- 
■riay at tke San Angele Relayt after raaniag feartk la the 
138-yam Mgk kamiet wltk a lime ef 14.1. Larry SmKk ef Abl- 
leae wea the event with a time af 14.4, breakiag tke eld 
ree«m af 14.7 iH  la 190 by a Fart .Starktaa lad. th e  Steen 
are now preparing far the Carlshad. N.M. Relays Satarday. 
(Phete by Kenneth (teed)

Y Swimmers

M

Third At El Paso

Runnels Scores 
In Abilene Meet
ABILENE — The Runnels 

eighth grade track team rolled' 
up 24 points in the Abilene Jun-j

lene Madison won the ninth 
grade division with 54V̂  points.

If the Steen win the first
game they will play the winner 
of the Monahsiins vs. Eunice 
game Saturday afternoon.

GOOD PITCHING

Astros Short 
On Punch

CfXDA, Fla. (AP) — Lum 
Harris is not the reticent type, 
but there is not much he can 
talk about when the subject is 
the Houston Astros.

There’s good pitching, pretty 
fair defense and the magnificent 
new domed stadium in Houston 
But aside from that the man 
vd)o succeeded Harry Craft as 
the Astros manager can offer' 
little in the way of newness. .

“ It’s the same old story with 
our club,” Harris said. “Good 
pitching and defense and short 
on punch."

work with more abandon if he
yelled. “Now you chunkin’ in 
there. Lunar Ticks’’ than he can 
with the present name. Also, the 
name Lunar Ticks lends itself 
to a fine family game.”• • 4

There was more hope than 
resignatioa in Harris’ voice, 
however.

“I think we will be better," he 
said. “How much, I don’t know. 
A great deal will depend on our 
young players, like Joe Morgan, 
Ron Brand. Rusty Staub and 
Jim Wynn.” ^

Morgan, a 5-foot-7 speed mer­
chant who was voted the Texas 
League's Most Valuable Player 
last year, is expected to replace 
Nellie Fox at second base. 
Brand, a 825,000 draftee from 
the Pittsburgh organization, 
apparently is the No. 1 catcher. 
Wi^n and Staub will open the 
.sea.son in center and rignt 'ield, 
re.spectively.

Morgan batted .323, hit 12 
homers and 42 doubles, and 
drove in 90 runs at Oklahoma 
City. And he stole 47 bases.

Al Spangler, a good defensive 
rformer with little power, will 

in left field for the fourth 
straight seasmi. John Bateman 
and Jerry Grate will support 
Brand behind the plate. Mike 
White, Bob Lillis, Ernie Fazio 
and Jim Beauchamp are the 
reserves. 'Fox, now a coach, 
may return to active duty.

“As far as our pitching is con­
cerned, we have virtually the 
same cast,” said Harris. “ It 
was good last year but it could 
be better because of our im­
proved defense.

Bob Bruce, Ken Johnson, Dick 
Farrell and Don Nottebart con­
tinue as the front four. Don Lar­
sen will be used as a  spot start- 

Jim  Owens, Hal Woodeshick 
and Claude Raymond make up 
tlM bullpen.

Rev. McAfee has even gone 
so far as to make up a d^ign 
for the Lunar Ticks and a list 
of Lunar Tick Daffynltions to 
go along with the new name. 
The design is above and the 
daffynitions follow:

Lunar Control: What the
pitchers have when they stay 
within the strike zone.

Lunar Distance: Whenever
the starting pitcher goes nine 
innings. (Which we might add 
is a ^ t  as often as a lunar 
eclipse.)

Lunar Explosk»: The way the 
|2  million scoreboard goes on 
a 45-second tirade when Hous­
ton scores: when the opposition 
scores, the ex|riosion is a minor 
one — “Tilt” flashes on.

Lunar Month: When 30 dli 
ferent men have played center 
field

Lunar Star: Any player who 
bats .250 for at least a week

Lunartize: What the players 
wear to travel, provided they 
match their lunarsox 

Lunartricks: The girls who

EL PASO -  The Rig .Spring 
YMCA girls 200-yard free-styte 
relay team placed third in the 
Y .Southwest Regional Champi­
onship here .Saturday with a 
time of 2:03 7.

The girb, Linda Cathey. Bert-j 
ie Duncan. Carrie Blzzell, and 
Gina Swift, missed a trip to, 
the national finals by six-tenths | 
of a second Teams from a four 
state area. Texas, Oklahoma. 
Louisiana and Arkansas, took
part in the championship.

The gym team placed third

show you to the wrong seat 
Rev. McAfee ends his tetter

in this way:
“ Please know that, for pur 

poses of reproduction in your 
paper, you not only have my 
permission to use the copyright­
ed design on the enclosed 

ummed sticker - -  you also 
avc my blessing!”
We have u.sed it. You know 

he might have something here

over all in the meet, with the 
girls team furnishing most of 
the points. Sharon Henson 
placed third in the side-horse 
vaulting. Ruthie "ussell finished 
fourth in free acts and tum­
bling, and Denise Graham 
p lac^  fifth in the side-horse 
vaulting Fred Green added to 
the total score with a fourth 
place finish in the boys rape 
climb.

ior High track meet Saturday 
good for a fourth place finish 

Twenty-three teams were en­
tered in the eighth grade com­
petition. The Yearlings racked 
up two first places with John 
Patton in the 330-yard da.sh with 
a time of 39 8 and in the 1,320 
yard relay team with a time of 
2:471. Members of the relay 
team include Roy I,ee Warren. 
Tony Perez. Claude Tucker and 
Patton

Hal Rosson
INCOME TAX SERVICE 

B Praoipt p  Reaseoabte 
388 E. 3rd AM M 5S  

Settles Hotel Bldg.

FRESH WATER

CATFISH
Patton was fourth In the dis-i 

cus with a toss of 134 feet. Tuck-; 
er added a third place finish in: 
the broad jump with a leap of| 
19-4^. Jes.se Brawn placed third! 
in the 229-yard dash with a time 
of 28 flat.

Ah*—RM M«RR«r, e m k  Oytl«rt

Charles Grocery
U lt I m i  M  d m  am  «410

In the ninth n ad e  division 
Goliad’s Donny Wiggins p lac^  
third tii the broad lump. Brown- 
wood won the eighth grade <li- 
vision with 45 points and Abi-

JIMMIE JONES 
FIRESTONE 

CONOCO
1581 Gregg 

Dial AM 4-7881

Crawley Resigns I BIG SPRING  
At Permian High

5UNLAND P'K. 
RACE RESULTS

ODE.S.SA — Jack Crawley, 
head basketball coach at Odes­
sa Permian High School here 
for the past six years, an­
nounced his resignation over the 
weekend effective Sept. 1.

His 1964 team advanced to 
the Class AAAA regional finals 
before going down to defeat. He 
will coach the North All-Stars 
in the summer coaching school 
basketball game before his res­
ignation becomes effective.

Crawley is the third coach toj 
'eave Odessa this school year. 
Head football coaches Bradley 
Mills at Odessa High and Jim 
Cashion at Permian were fired 
in December.

119 West 1st
Dial AM 4-4644

FIRST RACE (*V> furlOf»0*l-3MIIIO. 
11.40, S.n, 4.M; CuH Oott. 140. «.00; 
Fair FMI, *.00. Tim« 1:10 3

SECOND RACE (SVi furteno») — AD- 
b«vi J«l, S.S0, 3 40, 3.40. DmrII* Fw i 
n«r, 300. 3.40; TaroNowk. I0«0. Tim« 
l:0«.l.

DAILY DOURLe-40.40.
THIRD RACE (On* mil«) — WIW 

WIchIto, 31.00, 13.00, 0 40; Otfletr* Re­
word, 4 30, 4.00; Artnto, 7.20. Tim«
1:40.1. ------  -  dt)-C«ll M«FOURTH RACE (400 yordt)—CMI M« 
Rom , 1*10, I I .» , *.«0: Shortv Sox, 14.10, 
7 » ,  S«« U Lpt«r, 10.00. Tim« ».4.

OUINELLA—lu.00.
FIFTH RACi («70 yordi)—ThoH Juli«, 

3.M, ISO, Z.40; Spiaokv KM, 4.40, 3.00)
Tlm«lv, 3.». Tim« 44.4 

-SIXTH r “......  RACi »« fwriono*) — Wkk
inuf, 7.00, 4.00, 3.40; OrMn Rulen, 3.40,

Fu«ao e«lica, «.00, «.40 (< 
n«««). Tim« iJlIJL

SiVtNTH RACe (• furlen0()-a«aw 
Z*nHn, 1740. «00, 4 » ;  R«oMt*r*d Ntirw, 
740, 4J0; S«M R«v«no«, 040. Timo
1:13 0BIC QUINiLLA-14«).». .EICHra RACe (« furtoflRi)—CIMW.
S «0, l  O. 3 .» : M M Igon^i:^ . 4.«0, 340;
Lucky Bond, 4.«0. Tim«

NINTH RACE (On« mlM) — 0«aR 
Fotnem, «10, 4 00. 3 40; Slu« Tuck«r. 
13.40. SIO: McAbOcy, 4 » .  Tim« 1:M.4.

t e n t h  ra ce  (I 11« mll«)-ltKlu(lv«, 
1100, 7 » .  4 00; Noturol Flow, 10». 
S.»: cn«ap«rt DovM, 4 » .  Tim« l;4t.t 

BLtVENTH RACE (On« mll«)-H«rd
Lotfy, 1)00, S.40, 440: C w M n Tribal, 
341. ) .» )  Raodfro, 7ÌX  Tim« 1 ;» . l

O U lN iL L A -B .» . _
Atiwdenee 4471. ToM hwidUd SMa-
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1 On Alabama .
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1 SAN FRANaSCO (AP)—Dr 1 Martin Luthcir King J r ,  Nobel 
1  Prize-winning leader of the'dvU 
1 righta movement, says he wfll 
1  c u l for a massive economic 
1 boycott of Alabama p iquets.
1 King, yeaking bMore newa 
1 cameras for national television 
1 said Sunday his Soutbem Chri»!

lo tm  7ff/w e m  B e rn a l PRODUCE
m-

tian Leadership Conlercnoe 
would 8000 caU for an “econom­
ic withdrawal prom m .'* 

Following the m c  p ixm m , 
“Meet the Press," K i^  told a 
news conference he would dis­
cuss the plan with board menv- 
hers of the conference Thursday 
and Friday in Baltimore, Md.

SHUNS PBODUCTS 
King said he would ask labor 

unions to refuse to transport or 
use materials grown or numu- 
factorsd In Alabama and ask 
coosomers to boycott Alabama 
prodKta. He aald Im also would 
ask the federal government to 
withdraw funds from federal 
protects within the state and 
withdraw Its funds on deposit in 
Alabama banks.

" I  will call on the nation,** be 
said, **to rise up in a  firm actloo 
program. I would call first for 
something Bka a 10-day whh- 
drawal. llw n if nothing was 
done. I’d caD for a repeat of the 
boycott.**

i^ b a m a  L t Gov. James AO 
en said a  boycott as nroposed by 
Kim woold be a nort^righted 
solutloa to the problem, would 
hurt Negroes ‘*flrst and hard 
est’* and ’’would create a re­
verse reaction from what be 
would eipect.**

NO COMMENT 
In Washington, a  White House 

mokesman had no comment.
Alabama’s Atty. Gen. Rich 

mood Flowers termed the de­
mand “wrong and unjust,’* add 
ing “a  great many people would 
suffer that were not to blame 
and probably the greatest suf- 
feiiag woold be among the Ne­
groes of the state.**

Dr. Thomas Brigham, Ala 
bama GOP chairman, said pro­
posed federal legislation would 
cover King’s goails.

**I kind of question hie mo­
tives in bringing up new ques­
tions every 24 hours or so " 
Brigham said.

SOCIAL REFORMER 
King said he expected Ala­

bama growers and boslr—  
leaders to bring preisnrv on 
Gov. George C. Wallace for 
da l reforms.

Earlier Sunday in Grace Epis­
copal Cathedral atop San Fran­
cisco’s Nob Hm Ktag told the 
Integrated coogreganon racial 
Injustlco is a ‘te irib ls cancer' 
that Is “still the Nigroes’ bur 
den and America’s sume.** 

“Injustloe anywhere is 
threat to Justice everywhere, 
be said.

“We most learn to live togeth­
er as brother, or perish as 
fools’*

Rutabagas

MED. SIZE 
NO. I X  L i . .

G R E E N
B EA N S

Apples 
Squash

FANCY 
ROME 
BEAUTY 
LB...........

FANCY 
FLORIDA 
YELLOW  
LB.............

LIBBY'S WHOLE 
NO. 303 C A N . .

CATSUP ...........25*
PEARS IT S  £."!*!!'..!” .......39*
BEETS T i l 'S . ........2 ^29*

M  W n i M t ^  
vlth$L50 

pgrcIlBSt BT BItrf

! »

SUPER
M A R K E T S

SALAD MIX Collard Greens
Fresh, Table Ready Arlasaa, Nice And F n ih

2 for 25* ,« . . .2  for 19*t-OuBce
Package

Coffee
$ r

FOOD
CLUB,
ALL
GRINDS
1 L I.
C A N . . .

DOG FOOD Alt...........POTATois

hiEWFÜjni!

LIM Y'S  
46 OZ. 
CAN. . .PIN EAPPLE JUICE 

FRUIT C O C K TAIL! « " 5
Pineapple

Fresh Frozen 
FOODS

Drinks
U IIY 'S  
ASSORTED 
FLAVORS 
6 OZ. CAN.

LIBBY’S. TLR.MP, COLLARD

GREENS“ “".... 15*
U U V 'S  F U S I  riO Z E N  I I I V E L

SPROUTS“ "" 29*•^n* ••••

UBBY’S FR ESI FROZEN

0KRAi^...2 „45*

□BBT'S SLICED 
OR CRUSHED 
IN HEAVY SYRUP 
ISVh OZ. C A N . . .

/yscP
BOUTONNIERE
D IN N E R W A R E DESSERT

CORN UBBY'S CREAM 
STYLE GOLDEN 
NO. 303 
CA N ..................... 2i29

BRYAN (AP)-i*lra destroyed 
the M o n t^m e^  Ward store 
and d a m a m  five other busi­
nesses in downtown Bryan Sun-

CreamS-69
g y  ZA sM /zyrAZùaje.

K¥77f sñáf/

SUGAR
UBBY’S. PINEAm E-GBAPEFRUlT

DRINK SÎ"..,. 3 for »1*

C4H OR IMPERIAL 
PURE CANE 
HOLLY BEET
S LB. BAG. . . . . . . .

FAB King Site 
20s off label n ”

QUICK OR OLD-FASmON

QUAKER OATS ll-Oi. Hi 
42-Ox. 47«

FOOD CLUB. 4-OUNCE CAN

BLACK PEPPER 29*
69*

. .  C. Jones, m a n a g e r  of 
Ward, estimated the store dam­
age at $750,000 to $1 million, 
including about $300,000 in mer­
chandise.

The fire, the cause of which 
has not been detennined, dam­
aged the roof of a variety store 
next door to the Ward buOding.
Five other buildings In the 
block had smoke and SUPREME

^^^A po^inan saw smoke pour- GRAHAMS........39*
Ing from a ground floor window —
of the Ward store about 6 a m. '

Fireman from Bryan and Col-

l ib b y *s , p in k

SALMON S  c-
5i OFF ON UBBY’S, NO. SI3 CAN

Corn Beef Hash 35*

CLOROX .... 39*
UBBY’S. »OUNCE CAN
APRICOT JUICE 39*
UBBY’S, _POTTED MEAT 2-35*
RED OR YELLOW. 460UNCE CAN

Hawaiian Punch 39<

Action 43*
Baggies 29*
2 Ox. Pkg.

Vel-o>motic 45*
W# Reserve Tlie Righf To Limit 

Quo n Hies

COMPLETE YOUR SET THRU. APRIL 18
There is still time to tove en beoutiful "Beutennierc'* dinncrwore et 
Furr's. This week is your lest opportunity to toko homo the DESSERT 
DISH ot the low price. Compiote your piece settings new thru April 18.

Stops bad breath instaiitiy.. 
keeps breath fresh for hours

lege Station worked two hours 
before bringing the blaze under 
control.

FURR'S MEATS ARE GUARANTEED TO PLEASE

usfCRmr
LISTERINE ANTISEPTIC

20 OZ. FAM ILY  
SIZE. s e e e •

WEBB CITY, Mo., (AP) -  A 
scuba diver disappeared Sunday 
while trying to help police re­
cover a car from an abandoned 
lead and zinc mine.

Roy Hunt, 23. was presumed 
drowned. ' _

Police believe the car was the 
one that killed Benjamin Carl. 
II, in front of his home in Webb 
a ty  in a hit-and-run accident 
last Nov. 1$.

D ivan found the car on a 
ledge under about 70 feet of 
a«ter.

World's Fair 
Set To Reopen •

n e w  YORK (AP) —
Moses, president of the New 
York World s Fsir, says the ex­
hibition “is on or a ^ d  of 
schedule’’ for the April 21 open­
ing of its second and last

Round Steaki’̂  69
T-Bone Steakf“ "̂ 79

HAIR SPRAY
H-AJliaiHirranger SPRAY-A-WAVE 

MAX FACTOR .
Ì

USDA INSPECTED
SIRLOIN 
PINBONE 
CUT, LB.

PORKY PURE PORK

STEAK 59* SAUSAGE
REG. $1.00

69*

KOTEX .... 28*
....... 59*

FEENAMINT .... 29*
ASPIRIN '¿i“;:,..

2-LBS

10 GENEROUS PATTIES LONGHORN

PAniES Ä T  -  89* CHEESE Î.Ï 39* FiLLET S
BABY BEEF

LIVER FRESH SLICED  
LB.

GEISHA— SOLID INDIVIDUALLY PACKED

$4OYSTERS PAN READY 
RONELESS 
LB....................

SUPERMARKETS

/

■f . , Ili ' \  ^  . '.Í  : . f
7

'■ a :.
£

'A '



SMALL FAMILY? 
SMALL FREEZER

30-LB.
SPECIAL

INCLUDES:
•  10 LIS. STEAK
•  10 LIS. ROAST

10 LIS . GROUND 
REEF

A LL
FOR

SAVE S2.00

1 7 "

GROUND B EEF
8<A Big Spring (Tcxot) Mtrald, Mon., March 29, 1965

FRESHLY
GROUND.

F ILL  YOUR FREEZER A T  NEWSOM'S— NOTHING DOWN
I Mexicon D i n n e r |  UP T O  6  MO. TO  PAY! |t ACOS From Tho

Kountry Kitchon . *VFor

DIAMOND, 303 CAN(0RN....7for’1
B I S C V I T S

151*1KIM IELL*!,
CAN
OF
10 .....................

T IS S U E s r 12 ! MI [»BH Ml ■■ MtWSOMi

P EA S
DEL MONTE 
SEASONED 
NO. 303 
CAN .............. Si’l

AUSTEX

BEEF STEW  1 ^  » . 2.11

CORN OUR DARLING 
303 C A N .........

CORN LIBBY 
303 CAN

PORK-BEANS

5 for 1
6 for 1

Big No. 2 Can 5 - n

NEWSOME FEN FED— FROFERLY AGED

BEEF HALF Pound . 49*
COST? AFFROXIMATELY flOO TO $110 
CONTAINS AFFROXIMATELY
•  14 Round SOooki
•  I  Siilo ina
•  14 T-lonoa
•  I  Sirloin Tipa
•  13 Club Stooka
•  12 Chuck RooaN
•  Arm RooaH

•  2 Rump Rooata
•  1 Fiko^ Fook-Rooal
•  2 Engliah Rooata
•  35 Founda

•  Ground Boof
•  Stow Moot
•  Chili Moot
•  Short Riba

CUT AND WRAFFED TO YOUR FERSONAL 
ORDER —  DEUVERED IF YOU WISH! 

AND

F R E E
2 0  POUNDS YOUNGBLOOoF R Y E R S
WITH EACH HALF REEF ORDERED THIS WEEK 

a n d  —  UP TO SIX MONTHS TO FAY! 
CALL DON NOW — AM 4-2471

B O LO G N A JUMIO
SLICED. 5 i’1

B A C O N MOHAWK
PREMIUM
2-LB.
FKG........... 99c

FR A N K S SKINLESS, 
LB............. 25c

R O A S T
N E V ^ M ^ S
FINEST
FLAVOR
AGED
BEEF,
L I ............. 33c

DIAMOND

TOMATOES ^  6 for '1
DIAMOND

GREEN BEANS 7 for H

SMAU FAMILY? SMALL FREEZER? 
NEVrSOMl FEN FED —  FROFERLY AGED

CONTAINS AFFROXIMATELY 
•  7 Round Staaka •  1 Rum  ̂ Roaat

SPLIT SIDE BEEF POUND

COST? AFFROXIMATELY $50 TO $S5

F R E E !
•  4 SIrloina •  1 rika'a Faak React _  _  _ .

. G 7 T-Bonat • jQ  LBs F R Y E R S
4 9 ^  •  4 Sirloin Tipa •  ^

G 7 a«b Stauka Z  Ground loaf <4CH SPLIT SIDE
G 4 Chuck Raaat. G Stmr M.M
G 2 Ann Rooata •  ChIH Moot UF TO $ MONTHS TO FAY

U U Y . »OUNCE CAN

Pineapple Grapefruit Drink 4-H I CORN BOUNTY n S T  
13-OUNCE CAN 6for»1|

FRUIT COCKTAIL 5 for ‘ 1

T A M A L E S GEBHARDT'S 
NO. 2Vi CAN. 3 ^ 1

JEWEL 
3-LB. 
CAN . 49c

KRAFT

Chocolates
Mix or Match

3 1

SOUPS
HEINZ, MUSHROOM,
CHICKEN, CHICKEN NOODLE, 
MIX OR M A T C H ......................... 6 cans 1

KIMBELL, CAN

SHOESTRING POTATOES 10 for 1

KIM
DOG FOOD 
1-LB. CAN

1 3 -1
FLO U R FILLSBURY

S-LB.
BAG........... 39c

TOMATOES HUNT'S 
SOLID 
F A C . . . . 5 s *1

SPAGHETTI ...8-’l M ILK SUNSHINE 
TALL CAN 10 for n

DIAMOND, WITH BACON, 300 CAN

BLACKEYED PEAS 8 for 1
Vienna Sausage A LL MEAT, CAN . . . .  5-n 
PINEAPPLE JU ICE 12-OUNCE CAN 10-n

T C X A i " 4 i * l
T U N A Ä ? S « nk................. Scans»!

DOG FOOD 
Red Heart 7 ,oe’T
Red Heart S T  4,„,»1 
Friskiesc|£...... 7^. »1FOR

ROYAL
PACIFIC

$
CANS

TUNA
I DEL
MUNTE, FLAT CAN 3 f o r n

Blackeyes 6 »1
Pototoes „

Potatoes S i'S ... 7 n
Spinach "riiS...... 7,„,»1
nominy ^  can  .... 10 P « ,  »1

DEL MUNTEIvraUT 3D C A N .............. 6 n
V ______ALLENT ams 311 C A N ............ .. ®  FOR

BROOKDALE 1-LB. CAN

SALMON 2 for 1

P o t  P i e s MORTON 5 î * l
P a rd c iS FOR

Hi Vi “““f
LIBBY, MIX OR MATCH. I5W-OUNCE CAN

PINEAPPLE CRUSHED .........! 4 for $1

31-UZ. CAN . . .

Ken Ration c» .
l-LB. CAN

6  PAD
JELL-0  PUDDINGS ASST.

FLAVORS 10 for n
FOR6-n STRAWBERRY PRESERVES
FOR [TOMATO SOUP HEINZ 

TALL CAN 10 for »1
GIANT 440Z. CAN

Hl-C . . 3 for *1

LIBBY FROZEN FOODS
MIX 'EM OR MATCH 'EM!

GREEN BEANS, BROCCOLI SPEARS, 
BRUSSEL SPROUTS, GREEN LIMAS, 
STRAWBERRIES, CAULIFLOWER, 
PEACHES, WAX BEANS, OKRA----

IMPERIAL 
5 LB
BAG.........

10-OZ.
PKGS.

MIX TM  OR MATCH ÊM!
CORN, PEAS, MIXED VEGETABLES, 
SPINACH, TURNIP GREENS,
BLACKEYES, FRENCH FRIES, SUCCOTASH, 
CHOPPED BROCCOLI, MUSTARD GREENS, 
BUTTER BEANS, CREAM PEAS, SQUASH. .

10-OZ
PKGS.

PAPER GOODS
n o r t h e r n  G  I oweis g ia n t  r o l l s   ̂FC

T n w e UI O W e i S  i^ G . ROLL ..

Towels SJU Eou.
Napkins ""ntpeg 
Tissue

' o i l  « e y n o u m  3

Wax Paper ^

5  *1FOR ■

3 „ . . » 1
GRADE A, SMALL

2  . o . n

FOR

4  n^  FOR ■

B
SECTIC
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Child Dies O f 
Accident Injuries
Little Mary Elizabetfa Wise, 

10, struck by an automobile u  
she ran across the street near 
ber home last Friday, lost her 
fight for Ufe Sunday at 10 a.m. 
She died of her Injuries la tiH 
Cowper Hos|dtal.

She became the third traffic 
victim at INS In the d ty , and 
the fourth person to die la an 
automobile mishap in Howard 
County during M ara . Her death 
brought the total traffic deaths 
this year, county and d ty , to 
five.

The child was the daughter 
of Ed Wise and Lillie May Wise, 
1502 W. Sth. She was b o n  In 
B l| Spring June 1.1164.

Services will be a t S p.m. 
Tuesday la the NaUey-Fickle 
Rosewood Chapel. The Rev. 
Kenneth Andress, pastor of the 
Westside Baptist Church, wiD of­
ficiate. Burial will t e  la the 
CIW Cemetery.

ndlbearers are to be E. D. 
Sanderson, W. C. Boss, Don 
Smith and Elvis Caudill.

Survivors, In addition to her 
mother and father, are five sls- 
teri, Mrs. Christiae Gatllff, No- 
trees; Charlotte Jane Wise 
Prances Delores Wise, Velma 
Marie Wise and Sharon Kay 
Wise, all of Big Spring; one

brother, Ray V, Wise, Big 
Spriim; a hafi-slster, Mrs. Lillie 
Bell Martin, Blc Spring; and ber 
maternal grandmother, Mrs. E. 
H. Heffington, Big Spring.

Mary Eliabeth, In company 
with a sister, Velma Marie, and 
a cousin, Debra Alexander, 
sought to cross West Fourth 
Street at its intersection with 
Valley Street. Witnesses said 
that Mary Elizabeth ran into 
the path of a car driven by 
Mrs. Sandra BeO Guzs>, M7 
Scurry, wife of Airman 3.C. Jo­
seph Guz». Gttzzo was a pas­
senger In the car. PoUoe a id  
the car w a  taveUlng at le a  
than the legal speed Umit. The 
Guzaos stoMied their car imme­
diately ana attempted to aid the 
Injured child.

At Cowper Hospital, surgery 
w u  performed and blood trans- 
fusioo given. The child, uncon­
scious from the time of the Im­
pact, did not regain consdous-

Her fatal mishap w a  In the 
a m e  general area where an­
other child, Roaltnda Sando­
val, 4, w a  killed In a similar 
accident Feb. I. She w a  struck 

a pickup truck In the 1700 
Mock of West Third when she

ran Into the street. Mary E lia  
beth’s accident was in the 1400 
block of West Fourth.

The third fatality In the city 
also occurred on West Third. 
This w a  March 1 at the inter­
section of Third and Scurry. The 
victim w a  Albert D. G ratham , 
58.

Woes Of Having 
Money Eased
MIAMI, FU. (AP) -  “Presi­

dent Johnson is taking care of 
the poor. Well, I’m going to 
take care of the rich,’’ Mrs. 
Carling L. Dinkier Jr., a  At 
l a ta ,  Ga., socialite, said.

She a y s  she h a  undertaken 
a personal program to alleviate 
the woes of having money — a 
new yacht club in Miami so 
glanumHis the chrome • plated 
hinges are being gold plated so 
they won’t clash with the golden 
plumbing.

Cindy Coleman 
Wins First Place 
In Piano Meet
Cindy Coleman, eight-year-old 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Coleman, 5M E. 14th, Big 
Spring, w a  a first place winner 
in a Sonatina contest in Mid 
land Saturday. The first, second 
and third grade school students 
performed the piano selectioo 
“Little Suite No. 1’’ by Hassler. 
She is a pupil of Mrs. Fred 
Beckham.

The annual Sonatina-Concerto | 
contest is sponsored by the Mid 
land Music Teachers Asncia | 
tioa, and teachers enter their 
students by invitation.

First place winners performedi 
at a recital Saturday night at'

the First Presbyterian Churchi 
of Midland. ’

Betty McCann, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. T. H. McCann. 
702 Highland, and also a pupil 
of Mrs. Beddiam, won set»nd 
place in the seventh, eighth and 
ninth grade catagory. Her selcc- 
thMi was a Kuhlaa Sonatina-Op. 
56 No. S-aUesre tto grazioso.

One hundred and 25 students 
w «e entered in 24 categmies in 
the competition Saturday.

Other students from Big! 
Spring who entered from Uv 
fourth, fifth and sixth grade d t ' 
visioa were Pamela Wheelei I 
Connie Gary and Deborah Wash

Fedtral Civilion 
Employes Declint

I
WASHINGTON (AP)~A Sen­

ate committee reported today 
that federal civilian e n q ^ -

nw it declined by 4,417 persons 
fhiring February.

A report u id  it was the third 
consecutive monthly decline, 
and fixed the employment fig­
ure at 2,45I.5N.

Science Shrinks Piles 
New Way Without Surgery 
Stops Itch—Relieves Pain

TRY ^  
BIG H st 
SPRING K

IW  Twfc. N. T. i S r M M I . r o r  Um  
flrtt tim« selaBc« h«a found n now 
honling (ubiUneo wlUi tho aatoa- 
i*aing ability to shrink homor- 
rkoids, stop itching, and ralirro 
Rain —without anrgory.

la caoo aftor eaoo, whilo goatiy 
nlioviag paia, actual raduatioa 
(ahriakago) took placo.

Moot amasing of all—rooolU won

00 tkoreagh that saffonro mada 
astoaiahiag atatanoata Ilka “PlUa 
han caaaad to ha a problam!'*

Tha aacrat is a aaw boaling sa6- 
ataaco (Bla-Dyaa*) — diacanry af 
a worid-fansoua raaaarck lastitota.

This aabataaco Is aew svailaMa 
la sappasttary or OMSIataat f»rm 
aadar tho aaau ^roparaOaa If*. 
At all drag eoaatara.

Thurmond Likes 
To Be Republican

With Every Purchose
DOUBLE ON 

WEDNESDAY
With $2.50 PurckoseOr 

Mere

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Sen 
Strom Thurmond, conservsUve 
Southern Democrat turned Re-

C can, ssys his new role fits 
Just fine.

The South CaroUna Mnstor 
switched his party sUegtsnce hi 
the midst of the 1N4 preshtai- 
tlsl election c a in p e ^ , de­
claring himself a “Gohhrater 
RepuMicsn.”

He is listed as a Republican in 
the new Congress.

How has the change affected 
him and his fortunes?

“The Republicans have treat­
ed me very nicely.’* ssys Thur­
mond. “The Democrats have 
shown no ill feeling.**

President Johnson didn’t even 
mention tt when they met re­
cently at a White House recep­
tion to which Johnson invited 
him and other legislators of 
both parties, Thurmond report­
ed.

**I*D TALK BACK**
*T looked him right in the baO 

of the eye,” Thurmond said, 
adding that he would have 
talked back if the President had 
reproached him.

"I would have told him that if 
he was standing by the princi­
ples of the ConsUtutlon he ought 
to stand for, it would have beim 
different.’’

It’s his feeling, the militant 
South CsroUnlsn continued, that 
his switch was “more a case of 
the Democratic party leaving 
me, than for me leaving it.”

He meant, Thurmond ex­
plained, that he believes the 
DemocraUc party has swung far 
to the left of the prlncii^es for 
which tt stood when he Joined tt 
in his youth.

This wasn’t his first real 
break with the titular Demo­
cratic leadership. In IMS be was 
the States Rights party’s nomi-

nee for president, la a break 
with President Harry S. Tru­
man, the Democratic standard 
bearer. Thurmond carried South 
Carolina, Alabama, Mlssisslp|d 
and Louisiana.

**PR06PECT8 GOOD**
The Kuator now predicts good 

for the GOP in the 
He said be finds the Re­

publican party “more in accord 
with my own thinking*’ and he 
feels comfortable In tt.

la  the Senate, be said, “the 
Republican party and I voted 
the same 76 to 75 per cent of the 
time. It would have been easier 
If I could have voted 75 per cent 
with the party with which I  was 
affiliated,” but he said he 
couldn’t  do that cooadentiooaly.

Any chance he m i^ t  switch 
ba<± to the DemocraUc party la 
the future?

“I eee no dumce la the 
orld,** the senatw refdled.
The change of pvH es in­

volved both gains and losses for 
him, Thurmond said.

He lost his seat on the Com­
merce Committee as its 4th 
ranking majmity party mem­
ber, and the ciuürmanshlp of its 
surface transpwtsUon subcom­
mittee. He also wound up with 
less patronage, that Is, Jobs to 
fUl,

ON PANEL
But he gained a seat on the 

Banking and Currency Commit

R O D E O  
TICKETS
GET A $X00 RODEO TICKET FOR ONLY 49<
Witk 0 purchose of $15.00 or more (excluding 
cigarettes end tebocco).
BIG SPRING RODEO MAY 19,20,21 & 22
Simple: Just buy your groceries from Hull It Phillips 
ond sov# on your grocery bill and got your rodoo tickots for 49c. 
START GETTING THEM NOW FOR THE WHOLE FAMILY 

EFFECTIVE NOW THROUGH MAY 18, 1965!

PRODUCE

BANANAS
GREEN ONIONS 
CABBAGE 
ONIONS

GOLDEN 
RIPE 
LB...........

Gordon 
Froth . Sunchos

M ountain Grown 
Groon, Lb............

[t

AAodium 
Yollow, Lb.

PICKLES SS*«i1!a.» ..................................... 29*
TACO SAUCE  15*
GREEN CHILIES  23*
PORK 'N' BEANS S’ S ’* ....... 2 for 31*
PRUNE JUICE 5* ST ................................49*

89* 
49*

tee as tts third ranking minority 
party member, and would keep 
that rank if the GOP again be­
comes the Senate’s majority 
party. His GOP colleagues also 
made him the senior minority 
member of that committee’s 
securities subcommittee.

Tbe Republicsns let ’Tlnir- 
mond retain his membership on 
the Armed Services Committee 
sod on its investigative arm, the 
preparedness subcommittee

INSTANT COFFEE 
PAPER PLATES
HI-HO CRACKERS ...............................41*
HOT DOG SAUCE  27*
HOT SAUCE .....................................15*
KRAFT PARKAY u ................................  31*
MIRACLE MARGARINE u ...................... 35*
CHEESE WHIZ  43*

Hl-C
46 OZ.
CAM.'.........................

KIMBELL 
12 OZ.
CAN. . . .

O R A N G E DRINK
Luncheon Meat
F R O - Z A N  sSss.. 3i1.00
S U G A R  49‘

ICC  Examiners 
Okay Rail Merger
WASHINGTON (AP)— Merg- consummation of the proposed 

er of the Pennyslvanis and New merger clearly o u t w ^  any 
York Central railroads was injury which has not nor cannot 
recommended today by exam- be protected through tbe impo- 
iners for the Interstate Com- sition of conditions^tslc). 
merce Commission.

Strict condiUons were laid 
down, one of which would re-

The examiners did not recom­
mend inclusion of the financial­
ly troubled Erie-Lackawamiaquire’the two railroads to p W X

(reight K n r tc  «v«r t S i f S T *  ^  “ *
lines of me New Haven Rail-
road.

But Uie examiners—contrary 
to expectaUons Jn the railroad 
indusUr — did not recommend 
that the merged Penn-Central 
system support the New Hav­
en’s bankrupt passenger opera­
tions “unless a plan is provided 
to offset the present operating 
deficits on a sound economic 
basis.”

The merger, if approved by 
the full commission, would 
create a 19,631-mile system that 
would operate tai 14 states,'the 
District of Columbia and Cana­
da. ___

MAJOR CENTERS
It would serve most major 

population centers between the 
Eari Coast and tbe Missiaslppi 
River.

Examiners Jerome K. Lyle 
and Henry C. Darmstadter, who 
conducted extensive heariags mi 
the complex proposal, conclud­
ed:

“R Is our belief that tbe ovar- 
att to b t  M n d  C iW iltM ilii mUnads.

LEFT OPEN 
But they left the record open 

for 10 years to pnrmlt future 
consideration of such action if 
the Erie-Lackawanna is not suc­
cessful In tts attempt to be ad­
mitted to tbe Norfolk tc Western 
Railway System. That system 
has indicated tt will consider 
taking In the Erie-Lackawanna 
whenever the railroad’s finan­
cial condition improves.

As another condition of tbe 
recommended merger, the ex 
aminers would require the 
Pennsylvania and New York 
Central to attempt to locate the 
Lehigh VaDey Railroad — con 
trolled by the Pennsylvaata — 
in one of the other two m a te  
eastern railroad systema; the 
Norfolk k  Western or the Chesa­
peake It Ohlo-Baltlmore.lt Ohio.

Tbe condition was imposed, 
the examiners said, to bring 
about “the best possible com- 
p e ^ v e  balance between the 

company and ottMr

C R A C K ER S
CRACKER 
BARREL 
1 LB. BOX.

T U N A  
C O R N  
C H ILI

DEL MONTE 
FLAT
CAN ..............

BOUNTY KIST 
12 OZ.
CA N ..................

WILSON'S 
24 OZ. 
CA N .........

.uLL&PHILLip.
F O O D  S T O R E S

FROZEN
FOODS

MEATS:

FRYERS Grad# A  
Wholo, Lb.

FRYER PARTS
NECK And BACK ......................................  15*
BREASTS Lb 49* DRUMSTICKS Lb . 43*
WINGS 29* t h ig h s  Lb........... 43*

GROUND BEEF 
VELVEETA

Freshly
G round

Kraft's
Choose

3 lbs. 1.00 2 ¿ 79

C R E A M
PRICES EFFECTIVE MON., ’TUES 
WED., MARCH » ,  31, 31, 19«. WE 
RESERVE THE RIGHT TO 
LIMIT QUANTITIES.
NO SALFJS TO 
DEALERS.

MORTON 
ALL FLAVORS 
lA C H ................ s hBIL

CONVENIENT
LOCATIONS

Orange B09 SCURRY 611 LAMESA H¥fY.

DONALD DUCK
fi OZ. C A N ....^

FOOD STORES
r

'je I k



r

SMALL FAMILY? 
SMALL FREEZIR

30-LB.
SPECIAL

INCLUDES:
•  10 LIS . STEAK
•  10 LIS. ROAST

10 LIS . GROUND 
REEF

A LL
FOR .

SAVE $2.00

1 7 "

GROUND B EEF
8-A Big Spring (Ttxos) H«rold, Mon., March 29, 1965

FRESHLY
GROUND.

F ILL  YOUR FREEZER A T  NEW SOM'S— NOTHING DOWN
icon Dinner ¡ " S - ¡11 UP T O  6 MO. TO  PAY! [t ACOS 4.- »1

DIAMOND, 303 CAN

( O R N . . . . 7 f o r 1 T I S S U E 12 M 11fr es h  c a t fis h  ■ n e w s o m 'S!
BISCUITS

1 5 i » l
KIM SELL'S, 
CAN 
OF 
10

PEAS
DEL MONTE 
SEASONED 
NO. 303 
CA N .............. 5 i ‘ 1

AUSTEX

BEEF STEW c  2-SI

CORN OUR DARLING 
303 C A N ........... 5 for 1

CORN LIBBY  
303 CAN 6 for 1

PORK -BEA N S.r..:?:. s-si

NEWSOM'S PEN FED— PROPERLY AGED

BEEF HALF Pound . . . .  
COST? APPROXIMATELY $100 TO $110 
CONTAINS APPROXIMATELY

49*
14 Round SOtoks 
I  Sirloias 

14 T - Imioo 
I  Sirloin Tip« 

13 Club SOooks 
12 Chuck RoosN 

A rm  RooiN

2 Rump Rootft
1 Pikô s P«ok-Roo«l
2 English RoosN 

35 Poun^
•  Ground Boo#
•  Stow Moot
•  Chili Moot
•  Short Ribs

CUT AND WRAPPED TO YOUR PERSONAL 
ORDER —  DEUVERED IF YOU WISH! 

AND

F R E E
2 0  POUNDS YOUNGBLOOd F R Y E R S
WITH EACH HALF REEF ORDERED THIS WEEK 

a n d  —  UP TO SIX MONTHS TO PAY! 
CALL DON NOW — AM 4-2471

B O LO G N A JUMBO
SLICED. 5 iM

B A C O N MOHAWK
PREMIUM «
2-LB.
PKG. 99c

FR A N K S SKINLESS,
LB. 25c

R O A S T
NEWSOM'S
FINEST
FLAVOR
AGED
BEEF,
LB. 33c

DIAMOND

TOMATOES 6 for 1
DIAMOND

GREEN BEANS ??CAN 7 for •!

}M A U  FAMIIYT SM AU FKIEZIM  
NEWSOM'S PEN FED —  PROPESLY AGED

SPLIT SIDE BEEF POUND 49* Í
COST? APPROXIMATELY $S0 TO $55

F R E E !CONTAINS APPROXIMATELY
Round Stssks •  1 Rump Roost
Sirloins •  1 PiksT Psok Resst _  _  .  .

10 Lbs. FRYERS
Club SNok. I  w it h  ia c h  s p l it  sid e
Ckuck Roosts #  S t^  Msot _.*~~THIS WEEK—.

UP TO 6 MONTHS TO PAYArm Roosts ChiH Msot

Pineapple Grapefruit Drink 4-T [CORN ¿SuüSsSŜ .......... éforH]

FRUIT COCKTAIL 5 lor 1

T A M A L E S GEBHARDT'S 
NO. 2Vt CAN 3 i ’ l

Shortening JEWEL
3-LB.
CAN. 49c

KRAFT

Chocolates
Mix or Motch

$ '
BOXES3 1

SOUPS
HEINZ, MUSHROOM,
CHICKEN, CHICKEN NOODLE, 
MIX OR MATCH ......................... 6 ctns 1

KIMBELL, CAN

SHOESTRING POTATOES 10 lor 1

KIM
DOG FOOD 
1-LB. CAN

1 3 - 1
FLO U R PILLSBURY

5-LB.
BAG. 39c

TOMATOES HUNT'S
SOLID
P A C . . . . 5 1̂

SPAGHETTI ... 8-»l
DIAMDND, WITH (ACDN, 300 CAN

BLACKEYED PEAS 8 lor 1
Vienna Sausage A LL MEAT, CAN . . . .  5 - n

PINEAPPLE JU ICE 12-OUNCE CAN 10-n

| M I L K ^ ) ! r a  1 0  T o r n

PEACHES
KIMBELL,
GIANT
2«/s
CA N ......... 4 i 'l

T B IV A  S:4 ¡ *1
T U N A  c h ic k e n  o f  o  ii
I u n / A  t h e  s e a , c h u n k ....................................c a n s  i

Pot Pies MORTON 5s*l
LIBBY, MIX OR MATCH, ISVt-OUNCE CAN „

SLICED, CHU . 4 for nPINEAPPLE CRUSHED

DOG FOOD
Red Heart‘ i j j ; , .. 7  n'  FOR ■

Red Heart S T 4  M^  FOR ■

Friskies c “ ...... 7  n

PordiiS-.......... 7  n
M l  V i  CIANT
■■■ ^  ■ M4)Z. C A N ....... 6  n. ^  FOR ■

Ken 'L Ration “ ? ... 6-1
1-LB. C A N ........... 13 nFOR ■

TUNA
DEL
MONTE, r U T  CAN 3for’1

UBBY 
IN  CAN

8  „ „  »1
Blackeyes 
Potatoes 
Potatoes
Spinach .... 7 *1
Hominy ... 10 ‘1

FOR 

FOR

7  n'  FOR ■

Kraut K ” "....6,„,»1FOR

Yams Ä ........ 6 FOR

BROOKDALE 1-LB. CAN

SALMON 2 lor 1
I JELL-O  PUDDINGS SKi.. 10 for »11
STRAWBERRY PRESERVES 2-’l

GIANT 41-OZ. CAN

ITOMATO SOUP CAN......... . 10 for l |  | Hl-C . . .  3 for »1

LIBBY FROZEN FOODS
MIX 'EM OR MATCH 'EM!

GREEN BEANS, BROCCOLI SPEARS, 
BRUSSEL SPROUTS, GREEN LIMAS, 
STRAWBERRIES, CAULIFLOWER, 
PEACHES, WAX BEANS, OKRA. . . . 4 10-OZ.

PKGS.

S U G A R IMPERIAL 
5 LB 
BAG.

MIX 'EM OR MATCH 'EM!
CORN, PEAS, MIXED VEGETABLES, 
SPINACH, TURNIP GREENS,
BLACKEYES, FRENCH FRIES, SUCCOTASH, 
CHOPPED BROCCOLI, MUSTARD GREENS, 
BUTTER BEANS, CREAM PEAS, SQUASH.

10-OZ
PKGS.

PAPER GOODS
n o r t h e r n  3  | |

■ oweis g ia n t  r o l l s  ^  FOR ■

Towels |i ,̂oLL ...5 roB ■■
Towels r o l l  . ^  FOR

3 f o r  

3  ro R

3 f o b

4  fo r

Napkins ““GIANT PKG.
T i s c t j f i  h a v e  I I s s u e  m o Ll-ROLL PKG. 

NOLDS 
2S-FT. ROLL

p p * |  REYNOLDS

Wox Paper

’ 1

•1
•1
•1

•1

♦1

EGGS
GRADE A, SMALL

3 i 1

B
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Child Dies
Accident Injuri
Little Mary Elizabeth Wise, 

10. struck by an automobile as 
she ran across the street near 
her home last Friday, lost her 
fight for life Sunday at 10 a.m. 
She died of her injuries In the 
Cowper Hospital.

She became the third traffic 
victim of 1005 In the dty , and 
the fourth person to die hi an 
automobile mishap in Howard 
County during March. Her death 
brought the total traffic deaths 
this year, county and d ty , to 
five.

The child was the daughter 
of Ed Wise and LilUo May Wise, 
1502 W. 5th. She was bom hi 
Big Spring June 1.1104.

Services will be a t S p.m  
Tuesday hi the NaOey-Pickle 
Rosewood ChapeL The Rev. 
Kenneth Andress, pastor of the 
Westside Baptist Church. wlD of­
ficiate. Burial will be hi the 
CIW Cemetery.

Pallbearers are to be E. D. 
Sanderson, W. C. Ross, Don 
Smith and EIvta Caudill.

Survivors. In additk» to her 
mother and father, are five sis­
ters, Mrs. Christine GatUff, No- 
trees; Charlotte Jane Wise 
Frances Delores Wise, Vebna 
Marie Wise and Sharon Kay 
Wise, an of Big Spring; one

b r o ^ ,  Ra:

In, Big
maternal grandmother, Mrs

r, Rav 
Sprh^; a half- 
BdlM artln, Bl

Wise, Big 
sister, Mrs. Lillie

H. Heffington, Big Spring
Mary Elizabeth. In oorapeny 

with a sister, Vdma Marie, and 
a cousin, Debra Alexander, 
sought to cross West Fourth 
Street at its Intersection with 
Valley Street. Witnesses said 
that Mary Elizabeth ran Into 
the path of a car driven by 
Mrs. Sandra Bell Guzn, 107 
Scurry, wife of Airman S.C. Jo­
seph Guzxo. Guzzo was a pas- 

in the car. Police said 
the car was traveling at Iom 
than the legal speed Umit. The 
Guzns stomwd their car inune- 
dlately and attempted to aid the 
Injured child.

At Cowper Hos|dtal, surgery 
was performed and Uood trans- 
turion clven. The child, uncon­
scious m m  the time of the im- 
pect, did not regain consdous- 
ness.

Her fatal mishap was In the 
same general area where an­
other chUd, Rosalinda Sando­
val. 4, was killed in a  similar 
accident Feb. I. She w u  struck 

pickup tiiKA in the 1700 
'  West Third when she

ran into the street. Mary Eliza 
beth’s accident was in the 1400 

Spring; and her block of West Fourth 
E. The third fatality In the d ty  

also occurred on West Thlni. 
This was March 3 at the inter- 
section of Third and Scurry. The 
victim was Albert D. Grantham, 
51.

Woes Of Having 
Money Eased
MIAMI, FU. (AP) -  “Presi 

dent Johnson is taking care of 
the poor. Well. I’m going to 
take care of the rich,” Mrs. 
Carling L. Dinkier Jr., an At 
Unta, Ga., socialite, said.

She says she has undertaken 
a personal {»ogram to aOevUte 
the woes of having money — a 
new yadit club In MUmi so 
gUmorous the chnune • pUted 
hinges are being gdd pUted so 
they won’t  clash with the golden 
plumbing. ____

Cindy Coleman 
Wins First Place 
In Piano Meet
Cindy Coleman, eight-year-old 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Coleman, 5N E. 16th, Big 
Spring, was a first pUce winnar 
in a Sonatina contest in Mid­
land Saturday. The first, second 
and third grade school stndsnts 
performed the piano sdectlon 
“ Little Suite No. 1” by Hassler. 
She is a p u |^  of Mrs. Fred 
Beckham.

The annual Sonatina-Concerto 
contest Is sponsored by the Mid 
land Musk Teachers AssocU- 
tion, and teachers enter their 
itudente by invitation.

First p lM  winners performed 
at a red ial Saturday nlfdit

the First Presbyterian Church 
of MidUnd.

Betty McCann, dauA ter of 
Mr. and Mrs. T. H. McCann 
702 Highland, and also a pupil 
of Mrs. Beckham, woo second 
pUce in the seventh, eighth and 
ninth grade category, llw  seloc 
tion was a Kuhlan Sonatina—Op 
55 No. 3—allegretto crazioBO.

One hundred and n  student.s 
were entered In 24 categories in 
the competition Saturday.

Other students from B i g 
Spring who entered from the 
fourth, fifth and sixth grade di 
visloo were PameU Wheelt-i 
Connie Gary and Deborah Wash.

Fedwrol Civilion 
Employtt Dtclinw
WASHINGTON (A P)-A  inn­

ate committee reported' today 
that federal dvlilan employ-

ment declined by 4,417 persons 
during February.

A report said it was the third 
consecutive monthly decline, 
and fixed the em]Boyment fig­
ure at 3,451.565.

Science Shrinks Piles 
New Way Without Surgery 
Stops Itch—Relieves Pain

T R Y  4  
B IG  ■ S T  
S P R IN G  Æ Ê

Not Twfc. N. T. (S rM td l.ro r tk« 
Srst Um« iciMc« hu  (eamd • n«w 
kMÜinf »ubtUBM wiUl tiM MtOB- 

•killty to thrlnk harnor- 
rhaida, atop tuhlag, ai»d raliaao 
SNiB-vitlMat aargary.

!■ CMa aftar eaaa, whUa gaatly 
la liaTlaf paia, actaal raduatlaa 
(akriakaca) toak piaaa.

Maat aaaasiac at all—rasolta war«

sa tkoroagk tkat aaffarars aiad« 
aataaiakiag tutamaata tika "N aa 
kaaa caaaad to ba a problan!**

Tka aaerat ia a now kaaling la i-  
ataaea (Bia-Oyaa*) — dlaeaaary ad 
a worid-faaMBa raaaareh iastitata, 

Tkia aakstaaca is now aaaUaUa 
ia ««ppaaitory or ««ataiaat form 
nadar tka aaoM ^raparsliaa M  
At all drnx aeaatars.

SLiar

Thurmond Likes 
To Be Republican

WMi Every Furclioee
DOUBLE ON 
WEDNESDAY

WiHi $2.50 PurckeeeOr 
Mere

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Sen. 
Strom Thurmond, conservsUve 
Southern Democrat turned Re- 
publicnn, says hU new role fiu  
him Just fine.

The South Carolina sanator 
switched his party allegiance In 
the midst of the 1964 presiden­
tial election c a m p e ^ , de­
claring hlmsdf a “Goldwater 
RepuUican.”

He Is Usted as a RepuUkan ia 
the new Congress.

How has the change affected 
hfan and his fortunes?

“The Republicans have treat­
ed me very akely,” says Thur­
mond. “The Democrats have 
ihown no U1 feeUng.”

President Johnson didn’t even 
mention It when they met re­
cently a t a  White House recep­
tion to which Johnson Invited 
him and other legislators 
both parties, Thurmond report­
ed.

«I’D TALE BACE”
*1 looked him right In the ball 

of the eye." Thurmond said, 
adding that he would have 
talked back If the Presideot had 
reproached him.

"I would have told him that If 
he was standing by the princi­
ples of the Constitution he ought 
to stand for. It would have been 
different.”

It’s his feeling, the militant 
South CaroUnlan continued, that 
his switch was “more a  caae of 
the Democratk party leaving 
me, than for me leaving It.”

He meant, Thurmond ex­
plained, that he beUeves the 
Democratic party has swung far 
to the left of the p r in c l i^  for 
which it stood when ho Joined it 
in his youth.

This wasn’t  his first real 
break with the titular Demo­
cratic leadership. In IMS be was 
the States Rights party’s nomi-

nee for president, in a  break 
with President Harry S. Tru­
man, the Democratk standard 
bearer. Thurmond carried South 
CaroUna, Alabama. Mksisalppl 
and lAMkriaita

“PIOSPECTS GOOD”
The senator now predkta good 

prospects for the GOP In the 
South. He said he finds the Re­
publican party “more in accord 
with my own thinking” and he 
feels comfortable In it.

In the Senate, be said, “the 
Republican party and I voted 
the same 70 to 75 per cent of the 
time. It would have been easier 
If I could have voted 75 per cent 
with the party with which I  was 
affiliated,” but he said he 
couldn’t do that consdenUously.

Any chance be might switch 
back to the Democratk party In 
the future?

“I aee no chance In the 
world,” the senator replied.

The change of pe itk s  In­
volved both gains and kMsea for 
him, Thurmond said.

He loat bis seat on the Com- 
erce Committee aa Its 4th 

ranking majority party mem­
ber, and the chalnnanshlp of Its 
surface transportation subcom­
mittee. He also wound op with 
less patronage, that is. Jobs to 
fUl.

ON PANEL
But he gained a seat on the 

Banking and Currency Commit­
tee as Its third ranking mlnoctty 
party member, and would keep 
that rank If the GOP again be- 
comes the Senate’s majority 
party. His GOP coUesgues also 
made him the senior minority 
member of that committee’s 
securities subcommittee.

The Republicans let Thur­
mond retain his memberriiip on 
the Armed Services Committee 
and on its investigative arm, the 
preparedness subcommittee

R O D E O  
TICKETS'
GET A $^00 RODEO TICKET FOR ON LY 49«
WMi 0 pwrehose of $15.00 or more (exdwdint 
dgereftes and tobocc«).
BIG SPRING RODEO MAY 19,20,21 & 22
simple: Jnel buy your groceries from Hull 4  Pbillips 
•nd save on your grocery bill eud get your rodoo Hekots for 49c. 
START GETTINO THEM NOW EOE THE WHOLE FAMILY 

EFFECTIVE NOW THROUGH MAY 10, 1965!

PRODUCE

BANANAS
GREEN ONIONS 
CABBAGE 
ONIONS

GOLDEN 
RIFE 
LB...........

Gordon 
Froth . Sunchos

Mountain Grown 
Groon, Lb............

AAodium 
Yollow, Lb.

PICKLES 29<Pecan Valley
Sear Or Dill, Q t ...................................................

TACO SAUCE ÎSTÏi”- .....................  15#
GREEN CHILIES JSTci'“  ..................... 23*
PORK 'N' BEANS STST ......... 2 for 31#
PRUNE JUICE STÎT...................................49#
INSTANT COFFEE .......................... 89#
PAPER PLATES ÏÏÏL. m ...........................49#
HI-HO CRACKERS '¿¿...............................41#
HOT DOG SAUCE  27#
HOT SAUCE ¡sríS......................................15#
KRAFT PARKAY ....................................  31*
MIRACLE MARGARINE ...................... 35#
CHEESE WHIZ ¡r&ETSÍ «ot...................... 43#

Hl-C 
46 OZ.
C A N ........................................... ..........................

KIMBELL 
12 OZ.
C A N . . . .

O R A N G E DRINK
Luncheon Meat
P l i O - Z A N  s S æ . . .  .  3 i l . O O

S U G A R  4 9 ‘

IC C  Examiners 
Okay Rail Merger
WASHINGTON (A P>- Merg­

er of the Pennysivania and New 
York Central railroads was 
recommended today by exam­
iners for the Interstate Com­
merce Commission.

Strict conditions were laid 
down, one of which would re­
quire the two railroads to pro­
vide f r e i^ t  service over the 
lines of the New Haven Rail­
road.

But the examiners—contrary 
to expectations in the railroad 
Industoy — did not recommend 
that the merged Penn-Central 
system support the New Hav­
en’s bankrupt passenger opera 
tions “unless a plan is provided 
to offset the present operating 
deficits on a sound economic 
basis.”

The merger, if approved by 
the full commissira, would 
create a 19,631-mile system that 
would operate In 14 states, the 
District of CohunUa and Cana 
da.

MAJOR CENTERS 
' It would serve most major 
population centers between the 
Eari Coast and the ICississlppi 
River.

Examiners Jerome K. Lyle 
and Henry C. Darmstadter, wbo 
conducted extensive hearings on 
the complex proposal, conclud­
ed:

•n i t  our belief that the over

consummation of the proposed 
merger clearly outwdgh any 
Injury which has not nor cannot 
be protected through the impo­
sition of conditions’̂ ( s k ) .

The examiners did not recom­
mend inclusion of the financial 
W troubled Erie-Lackawanna 
Railroad hi the merged Penn- 
Central.

LEFT OPEN
But they left the record open 

for 10 yean  to permit future 
consideration of such action If 
the Erie-Lackawanna is not suc­
cessful in its attempt to be ad­
mitted to the Norfolk k  Western 
Railway System. That system 
has Indicated it wiU consider 
taking In the Erie-Lackawanna 
whenever the railroad’s finan­
cial condition improves 

As another condition of the 
recommended merger, the ex 
amtawrs would reautre the 
Pennsylvania and New York 
Central to attempt to locate the 
Lehigh Valley Railroad — con 
troDed by the Pennsylvania — 
in one of the o tb tf two m a to  
eastern railroad systema; the 
Norfolk k  Western or the Chesa­
peake I e Ohio-Baltimore k  Ohio 

The condition was imposed, 
the examiners said, to brinf; 
about “the best possible cinn- 
petltive balance between the 

company and oUmt

T U N A  
C O R N  
C H ILI

att hanfftta to bt dsclved lEpiii mmi nilronda.”

\

C R A C K ER S
CRACKER 
BARREL 
1 LB. BOX.

DEL MONTE 
FLAT
CA N ..............

KOUNTY KIST 
12 OZ.
CA N ..................

2 Í 2 9 '
WILSON'S 
24 OZ. 
CA N .........

üLL̂ PilILLiP.
F O O D  S T O R E S

FROZEN
FOODS

4ulí7PHILlip.
F O O D  S T O R E S

MEATS;

FRYERS Grade A  
Whole, Lb.

NECK And
BREASTS u ........49#
WINGS u ...........29#

GROUND BEEF 
VELVEETA

FRYER PARTS
BACK u. .................................. 15#

DRUMSTICKS u . 43# 
THIGHS u ...........43#

‘1.00Freshly
G round

Kraft's
Cheese

C R E A M
PRICES EFFECTIVE MON., TUES 
WED., MARCH 31, 36, 31, 1961. WE 
RESERVE THE RIGHT TO 
LIMIT QUANTITIES.^
NO 8ALF.S TO 
DEALERS.

I<

2 CONVENIENT  
LOCATIONS

MORTON 
A U  FLAVORS 
EACH................

Orange Juice B09 SCURRY 611 LAMESA HVnr.

DONALD DUCK 
16 OZ. C A N . « . .4

FOOD STORES
f

/

. Í



A Devotlonêl For The Day
j b t r e d  M irrH k « p  M c s ;  b u t lo v t eovcrc tb  aU t r e a u r c s r i o u .

PBAYER: Lord o i aU m o rd c t. he lp  ua to  h a te  th e  a ia  b a t  to  
lo w  the  t e e r .  E nab le  a t  to  tfaow oC hen th e  v o o d c rfu l B»er- 
c f  th a t wag diq>laped by th e  Sevior’t  d ea th  o p en  th e  ctqm. 
h i th e  R edeem er's  nam e we p ray . A m en.

______________ (From dw T pocr Rotm’)

The S a l t  Bar «Í Trxat has 
ta to s  m  a 
«B B  e f to 0# JoA dal E lh ia  

m tts Jadees lo ose thsir 
S  th t itln rM ^t et coati 

_ A hrW  WM fiM  Boa- 
day whh th t Sapra n t  Otort a i th t 
laitod  S a tH  as a t i te a d t í  th t 
coafT p**aii» a rta lm  »—*■»* m .
vermi oT th t « ot5 ob Sol

a portka et th t trtal

Admirable Defense
tí tht Jadet.

n  S  appareaL howertr, that th t 
A n c r ic a a b tf  was woefaDy icaoraal 
of Che lelr r tBlaa ceverae e facts of the 
ESes triaL Its brici speaks t f

BSet vas tried S  Tth Dbolct 
Col  at Tyier S  MC. jusaal gaflty

term t í  I  jwars. Ja tee  OtísV^’t a T  
■IPK. wdo pnBOH« Binnca w v m q b  
cotaraee to a  hatring «e a tnottoa 
U> pnhJb t ititragttag. t t  the tpaaáac 

et th t t o a ,  te th t doslBg 
t f  th t atalt. aad Id the re­

tara  of the rcrdtet  by th t Jary aad 
Hs aeceptaaot by th t caa rt N t le a

by th t lelt t iiioa c a m ^ . aad as- 
awts that r e k  t r  practíct wMch 
SNcs th t trtal Jadee dttcrettea lo 
p tra a t th t Mtirlsbie t f  ladkial pro- 
ceedtngs wB aateamtkaDy deay the 

the aqaal pndactloa  of th t

ter

U t  Texas bar's brief was S  
aaaacr to one fUed by the Anwrlcaa 
Bar Attonahnn which callad for a 
revesal of the E rtet coavktloa aa 
th t griaaili that Ettes had beta de- 
pm ed of dae process aad eqaal pnv 
tcetka of th t laws by bctac expoaed 
te Blfvirioa. Tht AiBericaa bar arga- 
raete mpporitd  Caata 8  of the aa- 
thflBl amwctatlca  which proM au l« a  
or atm pbotoerapi ^ T h e  Texas bar's

to the

At ae peiat docs the Amerlcaa bar 
ppaar la  be aware of the fact that 
oda* Texas law Jaron la a  itkm j 

are aet perateltd I t  mparaie.
ap if their dt- 

amlght. aad a r t  
aot pC Titted to watch id rrltio a  or

a dificfwajt  ef i 
of whether televi- 

■iM moahl aot 
be penaftted. Bat the hlaaket It 
stretched to the breaklag peiat whea 
It Is argaed that a  caaea of ethics 
s ta lls  a Btw coacapt of •‘coaatMatioo- 
al diawBsInas * th t fact is that there 
is bMafBclaat trtdeace to date to 
aaswar preperty the qaestlao of lele- 
rta la i e tm a h t  ef coart trIalL The 
approach hi Taxas has a t least the 
Tvxav Qv V  e x p e n n m ,
with the pnsid lng Jadpe ia fao oob- 
t n l  af the proceediBp aad the aa- 
thortty to tenahtote the axperimea t 
É lelertsloa appears to cocroach la 
the itlghtoar oa a defeadaat's right to 
a fair aod lagwitial trial.

VICTIM  OF THE BACKSWING

J a m e s  M a r l o w
Timetable Upset Ku Klux Klan-Now And In The Past

one part of th t Viet Coax 
tw  rnnqaest ef Sooth

At
thnetaNt for the rnnqaest ef 
Met Mam has beta thrown off schad-
Bk by the landing ef approxinutd y

•  US. --S .M  U S . Marines for the protectloa 
of Da Naag Air Base The loas of the 
base woidd have bees «»n»nw disas-

B ataa the Marines ware put ashare 
military eoarcas coaflrnted (hat the 
Viet Cong had matted five bataOioas 
Of n u i  force» lopporm  o j 
two artillery battahoos for what cookl 
be aa attack oa Da Maag Air Base

The coBccBtratioa was reporlcd tai 
th t r td a i^  of QaaM Tla, aboat B  
wOa  aoath of Da *<Mag.

Tht Vkt Coag win. a t least for 
the preaeat treat tha a ir bam gaard- 
ed by Martoes with great respect 
For U. S. fbetes caa concantrale ever- 
whehnlag power with land aad car­
rier-baaed aircraft ia cam ef attack. 
At thia poiat at least the claaMc shift 
from the empfoymaat of small detech-

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Presi­
dent Johnson deaoaaccd the Ka 
D ax Klaa as a  '‘hooded society 
of bigots ** Bigotry ia America
has a  loog UilprT but aot ia aH 
Its forms as rtornat. craM aad
lawbcaakiag aa the Klan.

meats to large fortes, omd ^  t te
Vietmhih la osarwbetm the 
hi l » i  has been delayed

R i c h a r d  S t a r n e s
Madness In Viet Nam

WASHINCTON — Tba Bamboozle 
CartalB behind which the Uaited 
Statas is wartng ondedared war 
agatast North Viet Nam has parted 

so Mightly and revealed some
d ^ e ra te ly  agiy dm m stances

ettal pcitat has been lost in 
the coatruveiiy that has raged s S k c  

disdosart that noalethal dimbling 
gas has been omd against Commo- 
Bist goerrilla forces

tenged. or whether it comes from the 
geopoUtkaJ maaipolaton ia the Sute 
Department , the CIA aad the MatioaaJ 
Setteity Coanefl. the olUmate coeda- 
sioa is the same—defeat ia Southeast 
Asia k  Inadmisstok. at whatever cost, 
the war mart be “waa ”

T te r t  have bean three sets of 
H ans: the '‘b v isibk  E n ^ "  
which spread acroas the Soath 
afler tha C k l  War; the Klaa 
which spanned tha coantry. 
North and South aad from 
Maine to Oregon afler World 
War I; and tha pream t Klaa.

Ia tha first two stages the 
Klaa Bsed terror and viokace 
raagiBg from beatmgs and 
floBhigs to lyachhigs. In the 
praaant stags kkaw ofn have 
baaa faaplicatad u  amrders coa- 
nacted with Wagroea dvfl rigbu 
drives.

moraUats who flogged both mea 
and wooM  for coatect  klans- 

A a n ip k  of 
tha moralizing and the inteOact 
behind it k  pvea in a new his­
tory of thg Klaa to be pohlishrd 
■ext month. “Hooded Amml- 
caaism’* by Dr. David Chal-

Be cites the cam of a di- 
Toroad womaa with two chil- 
drea who m anisd  a divorced 
farmer. Both were takca to the 
woods aad flogged by the

H a l B o y l e
Chocolate: A Skunk Poison

APART FROM profcsskwal (^ommo- 
nist propagandbla, no one contends 
the gas is anaJogoas to chemical-bto- 
kgical-radioiortcal weapons banned 
by the Wamkgton DisarmaniaBt 
Treaty of 1121-22 or the Geneva Trmty 
of I IS  Bat that, of coarm, k  not the 
point The point b  that world rmc- 
tion to the am of any sort of chemi­
cal warfare agent —bat particularly 
ga»—could have been anticipated by 
the most desperate bitter-end profes- 
nonal soldiers trying to stave off de­
fea t

Thk has kd  to desperate adven- 
tnnsm sach as the am of gas more 
poisonous to American repute than to 
the foe, and to soch creeping villakies 
as a news blackoat a i  rhbd as any 
Impoeed in World War H. The Ameri­
can peopk. who soon enough win 
be called upon to provide conscript 
troops to wage the war. systematical- 
Jr are being denied the information 
they need to reach mature democra­
tic decisions upon which to bam out­
spoken protest.

THE FIRST Klaa. begun aa a 
prank in IMS to frtghka atwiy 
freed Negroes with the hoods 
aad while sheets of the mem­
bers, developed k to  a Soath- 
wida society with sin b ier meth­
ods and a sm gk parpom; white 
supremacy

MEW YORK (AP) -  T h h »  a 
low i f h a

Membership was secret under 
the banner of ‘

From the bexbmiag of American in­
volvement in v k t  Nam the bask 
test has been between modem tech­
nology (of which helicopters and chem­
ical defoliants were early examples) 
and irregular native troops whose 
zeal and dedication compeasated for 
their unsophisticated weaponry.

THE UMTED STATES has been 
usuig horror weapons in Viet Nam 
almotrt since the beginning. Napalm b  
a far more savage instrument of war 
than aonkthal toxk gas. but strange­
ly enoogh tt has excited lin k  pro­
test. Worse even than napalm b  wMe 
phoaphorooa and proxy-Amerkaa use 
of that dreadful chemical pasaed al­
most nnnotked earty th k  month.

THE FAILURE of the United SUtes 
military tedaiotogy to defeat the Viet 
Coog k  a doleful (act that in the 
military mind transcends any Ideoiog- 
k a l caaslderatjoa It cannot be par- 
minad ta endure, since it would bring 
Into qeestion the whok worth of the 
aatfon’s $M bdUon annual defsnae 
budget and the roarveloatly compli­
cated tadastrlal sabstxucture n  su)>- 
ports Tba roost co g n t a ip im nit 
beard oa behalf of continaing the 
fight In Viet Nam k  the one that bi- 
tk la  defeat  there would lead only to 
nftU U oa tal Thailand. Malaysia and 
tha Pklltpptoes

Uae of these devloas k  a tn b  m a t -  
a r t  of how far we have gone tai Vkt 
Nam. Madness has replaced reason 
in Viet Nam. and desperation la s  be­
come the rationak for all manner of

'chivalry, human- 
tty, mercy aad patriotism.’* 
White supTMnacy was achieved 
by the 1870s — meaning Na- 
gioes were cemented Into sab- 
servience — and the Klaa pretty 
much faded.

The Klan at the time was aot 
alone in its wcrecy or its pur­
pose There were others Uke tba 
Knights of the White Camellia, 
the White League, the Invkibk 
Circle. P a k  Faces.

In i n s  D. W. Griffith produced 
America's first spectacular 
movie, "The Birth of a Nation.” 
based on 7110005 Dixon's pro- 
Klan novrt, “The Clansman.” In 
Georgia that year the Klan was 
resurrected under a burning 
cross on top of Lookout Moun­
tain.

cokm abt wouMat know 
didn’t open hk  maO:

The average U.S. husband 
outweighs lus wile by S  
pounds. She Ups tha scairs at 
127 pounds — ha wekhs 18.

Acne k  dreaded ^  aO setf- 
conadooi yoangrtan. and B  
per cant of teen aaers suffer 
from tt before raaduag matnri-
ty-

Mary k  a grand old name, 
aad sooK six nUDjoa Amencaa 
fammes bear R. John aad Mary 
kd  the hit pariuk k  duktren'a 
names for the first half of the 
21th century. Linda and Robert 
were popular ia the IH ts — now 
Jane and John are la favor. I 
think Kathleen and M arp re t 
are the lovaUest aounding 
names, but a friend of mine 
with false teeth says be prefers 
Cecilia.

tha Elder preferred tha boiled 
of owls

FRIENDS. IF you have any

S skunks ia your home, d e a l 
d them chocolate. It pokons

savagery. That is the real lesson that 
‘ 1 nathe use of gas has brought with tt.

ICafvrtw«- >«*•. Onnte F w iw t SynWeaN. Hit.)

THE NEW Klaa was stiB for 
white supremacy and still 
against Negroes but now. like 
soma other organizations of tha 
past, it was a p in s t CathoUcs, 
Jews aod Immipants.

The hooded ones also became

the critters.
Prosperity note; In INI 

Americans ate only an average 
of one quart of ioa cream a 
year per person, ia IMO. 10 
quarts. Thk year the figure will 
riae to over 22 miarts.

Snobbery in m  younp r set: 
Even S-year-ohk now prefer 
that their garb be called “ski 
suits'’ Instead of snowsuits.

Our quotable notables. “Giv-

ODD REGULAnOMS: Qb
German railroads you can re- 
MTve a aeat for your dog, aod 
take almost any kind of small 
pets in bedroom compartments 
—except p ip .

Comeback; Cycling is under­
going a Mg revival among exar- 
cke-coaarioua U.S. adults. Of 
the record 5.2 mflUon bicycles 
sold last year, 22 per cent were 
bought grownups for tbeir 
own pleasure.

B i l l y  G r o h o m  y o u r  G o o d  H e a l t h
I know several peopk who are

THUS WRETBER the approach k  
tha one taken by the Pcntagoniao,

il neopk
church members, out I see no dif­
ference in their lives from other 
peopk. This dkeourages me from 
g o ^  to church, although I have 
often felt Uke attending services.

J.W.

Ingrown Hair Gets Trapped Under The Skin

whose faith tai sophisticated military 
. . .  ••• chai-hardware k  being so successfully

The Big Spring Herold
elttrmunt

M A S T S -H A N K S
7W Icvrry  SW tArHtg. tw o *  W7»1

turn» m ttem  y  •• » f  !«»<»•
t u e s / s i c t i o w  tn oAvonc*.WVtete* PVf F" I t »

fey Hi S tg  S frU tq . I I  n  t io n lH t»  ond  O l  W

K vaor. Sv wHiMr I «  mu« ra « u t t*
W h««. II W ftiormWf. i  montM M j* .^

______ . m  and I M «  par y«or: bmmnd JW
mIM. II 7$ pdr mdidl«, 1 monNN I4.*l, 4 inuldHi 
•M l dnd It« .«  pdr

You cannot Ju d p  Cbrkt by those 
who claim to represent Him. Ckrtain- 
ly there should be a difference be­
tween church members and those who 
are not. There are many whose lives 
do not square with their Christian 
professions. But thk  k  excuse; the 
nypoerky of others means no escape 
for you when you face the Judgment 
of (rod. Henry Ward Beecher once 
said the church k  not a gallery of 
saints but a congregation of confessed 
sinners I seeking redemption through 
the cross of Jesus Christ.

«V  A H O c i A T g 5 ~ e p a S t  h  d P c M t v « « /
___I «  tH« VM «f ON ntw$ dHOWcH« 0 «S
ta  N d r  Pd* dIH drw tad erdW tad ta  Ih d  pdp«> j  
a t w  H id  laodi n m  p u M H H d d  l « r « M .  A N  rif 
ta r  r t p d W k s N s n  p (  « k W  «H p d M IW I p rd  I

On Car(ds

AM

KANSAS CITY (AP) -  Grandma 
Moats’ racoUactlons or rural CSulst- 
maaes naarly a century ago are ap­
pearing oa Christmas cards again, for 
the first time in seven years.

The littk  old lady of Fagle Bridge.
N. Y., who itarted painting in her 

(o world wide fame,70s and soared 
died at 101 in IN I.

JiñjLÁíiSwTrhi hkow h #
W  A u dU  e pradw  Pf C ln u ln tw m . d  
d i p f w i  d M c H  f n d k « i  d M  '» p o r t «  pn 
^  t t  M l  p d W  « H o MditaP

séêîi

Hallm ait first reproduced her paint- 
in 1M7 and used aotne

f S T A f i v i - T d P d «  M in p . 
I A l HU m  C M  M i s . .

IB  Big Sprlag, Mon., Mar^ ¿0, lOIS

Inga on cards 
50 of her paintings daring tha follow 
taig 10 years.

Tba present sarks of cards a r t  dif­
ferent palntinp.

By JOSEPH G. MOLNER. M.D.
Dear Doctor: My husband suf­

fers from taigrown facial hairs. 
Does using an electric razor 
cause thls?-M Ri). R P.

No, because ingrown hairs 
pestered people long before the 
ekctric razor was invented. In 
fact, in some cases and under 
some circumstancas. an electric 
razor helps the {xobiem. Other 
times not.

Hair (or whiskers) grow from 
a bud or root, lying below the 
surface of the skin. Sometimes 
the hair may grow straight out, 
but mostly it grows at an an- 
gk .

Now let’s see what happens 
when we cut the hair off short, 
or shave. If the hair or wbi.sker 
grows normally, it Just extends 
above the surface of the skin aod 
becomes part of tha beard.

But suppose that instead of 
growing out the usual way, it k  
aimed at a slightly different 
angk. Instead of g r o w i n g  
through its usual channel, it 
bits the under side of the skin 
and can’t puncture a h o l e  
through which to grow. The hair 
keeps on growing, but it can’t

Sit out So it tben tends to curl 
to a ball That’s an ingrown 

hair. It festers aod becomes 
foia and k  a  thorough ouisaiica.

An ingrown hair isn’t  neces­
sarily confined to shavers or to 
men. A hair may be pulled 
out, or may be broken off below 
the surface of the skin. When it 
starts to grow, it can "stub its 
toe,” so to speak. It may get 
trapped below the skin, and 
then have to cufi up as it grows.

Exactly WHY thk  happens to 
some peopk and not to others 
is not entirely understood. May­
be the angle of growth k  im­
portant Maybe the skin texture 
is too tough. Maybe the hair k  
naturally early.

But shavtaig too close certainly 
can be a factor. If the stub 
the hair, after a shave, remains 
a t or above the stda surface, tt 
win Just grow out normally.

^ m  experience, we also 
know that shaving "with the 
grain" k  helpful. Tba real rea­
son for, thk  may be that we 
can’t shave quite so close.

henKNTfaoids or a fksure, bat it 
could be cancer. Wliatever it k , 
the sooner the facta are deter­
mined by medical examination, 
the sooner you ‘vill be comfort­
able again. The troubk obvious­
ly isn’t going to d e a r  up by it­
self.

Dear Dr. Molner: la It pos­
sible for a man with only one 
teatick to become a father?— 
L. M.

Yes, certainly provided It k  
normal.

A r o u n d  T h e  R i m
All It Takes Is A Rain

One tUng and anoAer:
Whea d k  prioe of bogi k  Mgh. 

lowa bactanae fiw ifehest fann state 
k  the aattoB. WVea the cori of d iru i 
kcyncfcak; t te t  dMHDctkm shifts to 
CaUforataL

Bat w b a  fi»  ra k s  cobm aad all 
a d k r t h k p  move ahaig a t an evaa 
kaal. Tenaa caa d a te  Ma Mggest 
t a t e  k c o p a  of an thè coramon-

Each day Amerfcaas nae over 48 
miUka galfons of pctrokum and abooi 
8  per cent of R goes tatto motor va- 
liirtes The cuasam ptkn of gnsoliai 
for an uses avarafK  soma IM n t -  
tton gallons dally and daring tha 
coarse of a  year antomottve en- 
gtaies ow aboat one biOkn gallona of 
labrtcattag oOs.

LARGEST lEU G K R'S paper wtth 
a  paid d ren k tk a  k  ‘‘Dackka.'* a 
pebileatkia ediisd by the BiDy Gra­
ham peopk. Tba

over S JN .M  ropk i of tha edl-

MOTOnsT Rkhard Raaacll ef Bkk- 
erky , Bsglaiid. n id  that k  a foar- 
month MW rey of M  drivers who over­
took him bv speedtak. 2f7 were won- 
ea. Aad of tho«  2IS were wearing 
glasHs.

1 do n t know wbat he’s trying to 
prove.

I N  A RECENT edftton of the Cath­
olic Digest Dr. Sander Feldman 
n y s  that maanerkma of speech can 
often give away your peraonaUty sub­
terfuges. He cites the fonowtaig ex­
am oks: , ^

*^o be frank”  or "to be honest’’— 
Whea a Oaraon injecti thk  tatto hk 
conversation, it k  an tndicatioo he k  
not always frank or bonaat.

“ Am I right?”—He’s so unsare of 
Mmself he needs a yes-man.

'  “I  can’t find the words to describe” 
—Chances are the speaker k  takio-

INODENT.AUY. AaericaBS ragk- 
tarad aboat M mfflfaai aatomobües 
b a t  year, comparad to t t 7  laflhnn th t 
preceding year.

More than hatf of an the reh ldei
( S  per cent) were regktered to U 
■tales; Cahforak, New York. Texas, 
Psnaayhraaia. O to . ataw k. MkhigaB. 
New Joraay, Florida and Indiana.

“WOULD YOU do me a favor^”— 
Beware thk  buttonhok approach. 'The 
attttude k  mdair becaoM it traps the 
listener.

‘T don’t care”—b  moat cases the 
speaker cares very much.

“I woolda’t do it for a raflUon dol­
lars”—Likely he or she would do it 
for mneh kas The expresrion indi­
cates the person has been tovtaig wtth 
the idea. -TOMMY HART

Ho e s e X a n d e
The Wrong Remedy

Than, (bataners says, one of tha 
doggers, a  fbnw nan m tnkkr, 
told tha womaa;

“Sktar, yon were aot pun­
ished to aager thk  e v e a te ; yon 
were ponkhed k  a  spott of 
Ittadnesa and correetka. to set 
yote feet arixht and to Mtow 
yoor cfalUreB MW a good moth­
er thoold go."

The flooB v  then took ap a 
coOactfoa. Chalmers n y s , and 
gasa th t woraca |S J l  aad a boL 
t k  of vaaeUnt tor bar woondB.

WASHINGTON — President Jotan- 
mn has twkted the araas of bob- 
aamoMn, aad sSbreqaently patted 
their heads, to get them to refrain 
from making further tarvestroenta 
abroad.

Tba kapücatíoe k  that tha saHhh 
Reta to take advantage of foreign wage 
rates and cuMamcr hnager k  tan- 
portaatly rawxwsibk for the abaard 
and daagenms fix wa*re k  as to in- 
tereatioaal finance. We are  sending 
oat more money thaa wa are earn­
ing abroad aad being onr gold re- 
■erres at a  nrinooi pace. We are. to 
paraptaraae WiR Bogen of bog  ago. 
the only a s tb o  on earth wWch ridas 
ta hDnÓT to the poortacoae.

onr lomas abroad, whflt the govern- 
rnent has steadily taiereaaad them. In 
IMS the baknea of peymaot for bnsi- 
aesa waa pta» N N  mfllba. which 
came beck to the Investors. The gov­
ernment’s baknea of payroant w u  
minus abnoat 14 bOUoo In 1N3. busl- 
HAHM was phis IIN  millba. govern- 
meot minus over 8  billion: ta 1M4 
bttstaien again was nhw t lN  millbn, 
govannnea t minus Q  bOUon. Last 
vaar tinitairn abroad brohe even, de­
spite much harassment, whereas gov­
ernment went to the hok tor the tax­
payer by almoat 8  5 bfllbn.

THE IDEA of bbm inc most of oar
economie and aortal IDs oa profit 

irresk tiok  U

lag k  the secret of a  bcalttay 
hfe. Not necessarily money, 
bat whatever a man Ima of an- 
couragement aod s)mpathy and 
Mdeirtaading”  — John D. 
Bockefelkr Jr.

■eaker i  has b a g  baaa irresk tibk  to 
Bberal politidaai. Mr. Johnson’s Wick- 
and^arrot method k  only a  vartatbn 
of the older btanes-pladng. bat be 
doaa tt more adroitly. It k  past time 
aoatiebody aNed — ta tt the fault of 
basmeamnea that oar general cconoiay 
k  suffering thaoe foreign bores?

T ht qaewioaa ware brongtat up to­
la tact, thrv ware flong Into the teeth 
of — the Senate Banking and Cur­
rency Committoe the other day. Aa 
indastrial r m a r cli groop called the 
International Economb PoHcv Aawv 
d a tb n  daitvered to (knttol HID some 
facts and figures  wWch prove again 
that the Amreican natba  sometimes

IT DOESN’T take a wizard of finance 
to see what wa must do to achieve 
aa eqnilflgium. We most make tt 
easier for business to invest abroed 
and make it harder for government 
to aretd oat its bans, grants, bureau­
crats and garrtaooa. Ia short the 
President’s reroarts ought to be ad- 
dresaed to AID, the Defensa Depart­
ment and tn American partkrtpaats ta 
the World Bank, the In tenu tboal De­
velopment Asmeiatbo, the Inter- 
American Bank and varions United 
Nations agencies. The nooral soasians 
wtairti Mr. Johnson has used upon 
bostareasmen. and to wtabta they hare 
generoosly responded, are the wrong 
remedy.

A.N OLD afilietioa; It k  aWi- 
matad that 75 mflUoa Ameri­
cans have had hangovers.
Scientists beliere they are 
caused by the fart too mach 
alcohol reduces the supply of 
oxygen to the brxia. Ancient 
Egyptians ate boiled cabbage to 
adeviata hangover pangs. ’Tl- 
berias, the tem an  emperor, 
chewed bitter abnonds. PItoy

5 to spife of tts political kad- 
Only onr taicradmk qaality ofenhip.

indestracühfltty has n v ed  as.
IT TURNS OUT from statistics avall- 

aMe at tha Commerce Department 
that the private sector d tber breaks 
even or mahes a  profit for Aineri- 
caaa In its overseas transactioes, 
whfle the pablic rector consistently 
runs a  dMldt la  tba Kenaedy-John- 
son years, bustaresa has served to cot

ONE METHOD proposed to the Bank­
ing and CarriBcy (bminittce was to 
raconvert onr (onign aid programs 
back to Lend-Leare. This might mean 
aome bares ta hardware, bat it wonld 
fre t OS from the chttebes of conn- 
trlcs wtairti are begbmtaig to control 
our credit, and hence onr taternal 
and external poRdcs.

We 8tin have not kicked the habit 
of making tariff laws, trade agree­
ments and taternatbnal treaties that 
favor Just aboat everybody — except

lOWrewtaM tar W cW «»« H K .)

eggs
Peace, it’s wonderful: Mora 

than 8  miUion peopk ta the 
United States own guns — and 
there are 20.6M federaL state, 
county, and municipal laws and 
ordinances dealing with fire­
arms.

D a V d L Qv/ v e n c e
Election By Union Card

WASHINGTON-Tba N atbaal U bor 
Raktions Board reoenUy anoounced 
that, although the slgntag of cards by 
worker s aatborizing a onion to repre­
sent them as toQertive • bargaining 
■gent is legal, aa empbyer "who be­
lieves that cards do not reflect the 
true choice of his enqibyes” can get 
an election in which a secret bafiot 
wouid be cast. But In a  care Just

a  majority of the empbyes, designat­
ed the unba as bargaining agent
Testimony was prewnted that some 
had been signed under a misunder-
staoding as to the purpow of the 
card. One had been signed without 
the worker ever having seen I t  since
tt was received by mail at his home 
and signed by his wife. Other em-

decided by the U.S. Court of Appeals
‘ % ardfor the Fifth Circuit, the Labor 

was, ta effort, rebuked for having in­
tervened even when both sides had 
■greed upon a  secret election, and for 
having instead granted recognition to 
the utaon at b a i^ in ing  agent on the 
basis of signed cards.

pbyes understood that, by signing the 
card, they were merely seeking to ob­
tain a secret-balbt elertion. T te court 
said:

"We think that in refusing to con­
sider the subjective Intent of the sign­
er of the card. In light of the ambi-
guity on the face of the card, the 
board erred . . .

THE LABOR BOARD had ruled ffiat 
the cards, distributed among the em­
ployes, were sufficient evidence of au­
thorization despite the (act that there 
eras considerabk dispute aa to wheth­
e r the cards had been legally signed 
by a majority of the empbyes.

The opinion of the court draws at­
tention to the nature of the card that 
was distributed by the union. It con­
tained a seetbn designating the union 
aa collective-bargaining a m t ,  but at 
the bottom of the card there was a 
specific statement that the card was 
for nw  in support of a demand either 
tor recognition from the company or 
"for an NLRB election.”  The employ­
e r  said be did not believe that the

" U  WOULD BE very simpk for the 
union to prepare a card that In an
unambiguous f o r m  would authorire 
unkn reprewnUUon as a bargatatng 
agent. If the union also wished to have 
cards signed to call an election this 
would also be a very sim |to matter. 
There can be Uttb excure for com­
bining the two in a card that makes 
possibk the misrepresentation that the 
board found to have existed Iri the 
case of McElveen, and the misunder­
standing that the examiner found as 
to three other em pbyw  and wMrti we 
now find as to four empbyes.”

AH this contradicts the statenoent re-
cently issuto in behalf of the National 

Relations Board to the (ness.
union represented a majority of the 

uiya empbyes and declined

What about___  ____  constipation?
Many can be relieved of it, both

company’s empbyes and declined rec- 
osm tbn until such time as it was cer- 
tifkd by the Natboal Labor Relations
Board. Tba court opinbn says:

Labor
declaring that any empbyer 'could 
have a aecret-ballot election provided 
be didn’t  commit an "unfahr labor 
practice” prior to the holding of such 
an election.

Dear Dr. Molner: W h a t  
maket me pass bJood every 
time my bowks move? I was 
constipated about' two fflonths 
■go and that is when it began. 
Could tt be hemorrhoid fistula 
or cancer? It hurts almost ail 
of the time, but not too badly. 
-M R S. C. B.

The Hktly cause would be

mentally and physbaUy by 
reading the bookkt ’’the Way to 
Stop Constipation.” For a copy 
write to Dr. Molner ta care of 
The Herald, enclosing a bng, 
self • addressed, stamped en­
velope and 20 cents tn coin to 
cover printing and handling.

' ‘THIS WAS folbwed by a consent 
agreement signed by the respondent 
(company) and the charging union
agteetaiK to two eketioas, one to be 
held with respect to each of the rep-

THE RECORD SHOWS that the La­
bor Board’s rulings have favored un­
ion-card elections. This denies the 
secret baDot to American citizens even

a n te  employing units.
"Then, however, two days before the 

date aet for the election the charging

thourt their Jobs may be a t ita te . 
For ta many states, unless an employa 
Is wiHIng to Jotai a unbn, he la de-
prived of his Job, That’s how "dvO

Dr. Molner welcomes all read­
er mail, but regraU that due to 
the tremendous votuine received 
daily, be is unabk to answer in­
dividual letters. Readers’ ques­
tions are incorporated ta his col­
umn whenever possibk.

unkm filed its unfair labor c h a rm
refusal ofwtth the board baaed on the 

the respondent to recognise its bar- 
O tatag  alatus without an ekctloo. 
This, of course, aborted the ekrtioa.”

rights” are manipulated by tricky
of U»

THE COURT pointed out that the 
board neverthekre had decided that 
the cards, which had been ligned by

methods ta many parts of the coan­
try  and given sanction by a  federal 
government board. None of the “ lib­
erals” has thus far suggested that 
"federal registrars” be appotnted to 
supervise these "unioa • c u d ” eke- 
tkms.
( O w m « M ,  1*41. N « w  V a r «  H a ra M  T r W im w  M e .)
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WASHINGTON (AP) -  Am- 
bas.sador Maxwell D. Taylw, 
who saya be thinks “things are 
turning for the better” ta Viet 
Nam, confers today with Secre­
tary of State Dean Rusk and 
other top State Department offi­
cials.

Taylor returned Sunday-from 
Saigon to meet with President 
Johnson ta what waa billed as a 
periodic, across-the-board re­
view of tbe U S. effort ta the 
Southeast Asian country to halt 
Communist subversion aod 
aggression. No time has been 
announced for tbe White House 
meeting.

Landing at Andrews Afar 
Force Base outside Washington. 
Taylor reported that there is 
“an air of optimism at the 
present time” ta Saigon about 
tbe antiguerrllla campaign 
against tbe Communist Viet 
Cong.

NOT RESIGNING
Taylor said he had no specific 

recommendations to make to 
the President. When questioned 
about a report he would resign. 
Taylor u id  "there ta nothing to 
it.’

The CS-year-old ambassador 
was chairman of tbe Joint 
Chiefs of Staff when Johnson 
named him to the Viet Nami 
post last June.

En route to Washington he 
conferred in Honolulu «nth U S. 
Pacific commander Adm. U S. 
Grant Sharp. When he arrived 
here he made these points;

On the campaign against the 
Viet Cong: “I’d say that the 
feeling of the people is that It ta 
improving ail the time ” 

MORALE IMPROVED
On results of the air raids 

against the north: They have 
produced "a  very clear lift ta 
morale” in South Viet Nam.

On the political situattan in 
South Viet Nam; it has im­
proved since the civilian Quat 
regime took over in February.

On the possibility of Red dii- 
na sending ta ground forces: 
“There are no incUcations of any 
sort” that such a Communist 
move ta contemplated.

Although Taylor’s optimistic 
views were not fully shared by 
officials here, the am banador’s 
predecessor ta Saigon, Henry 
( abot Lodge, also saw reason 
(or encouragement.

With measures now being tak 
en, Lodge said ta a recorded 
television interview on NBC’s 
“ Sunday” program, matters are 
“going to inqirove as time goes 
on.”

Referring to the U.S. and 
Vietnamese air strikes against 
the Communist north. I,odge 
said, “ I believe the measures 
that we are taking against 
North Viet Nam are going to 
make them realize that this ad­
venture of theirs ta unprofita­
ble.”

Front Moves 
Across Texas

^ c o f f e e  CUP
70/Í /AU J€ W /r-H iAC tf

rw i-v c K  a , M kk u

COFFEE
FOLGER'S, ALL GRINDS, 4s OFF LABEL, 1 LB. CAN

................ 74*
DEL MONTE CUT, NO. 303 CAN

GREEN BEANS. . .  25’
DU RITE, GALLON PLASTIC

BLEACH.....................29
FESTIVAL STRAWBERRY, 32 OZ.

PRESERVES............. 59
RITE GOOD, ASSORTED FLAVORS, NO DEPOSIT,
NO RETURN, 28 OZ. BOTTLE

DRINKS . . .
These vataes are 
gMd March 3141, 
INS ta Big Sprtag. 

Texas.
We r eserve the 

la Lhall 
iBdUet!

r M  t 
^ 1

By Tlw AIMCMM er«M

A cold front preceded by scat­
tered thundershowers, consider­
able fog and drizzle moved 
across 'rw as Monday, and low­
er temperatures were expected 
in mort portions by Monday 
night.

The weatherman has called 
for clear to partly cloudy skies 
over West Texas, but with con­
siderable cloudines.« elsewhere.

Showers were expected over 
the ea.st and south portions 
Monday and Monday night.

Austin and Lufkin reported 
drizzle and fog during tbe early 
morning hours Monday, and the 
DalUs-Fort Worth, southeast­
ern, and central Texas areas
reported cloudy skies.

Except for the expected tern-
I, the weather for

► State today ta expected to 
pretty much like tiie damp 

•udiness the sUte experienced

perature 
the
b® r  - 
cloudiness
Sunday. , ^

Tempears in the early hours 
today ranged from 35 at Ama­
rillo In the Panhandle to 72 at 
Brownsville in the Rio Grande 
Valley.

Stock Exchange 
Buys Site For 
Headquarters
NEW YORK (AP) -  The New 

York Stock Exchange said to­
day it has bought for $7 miUtaa 
a site in the Wall Street aectioo 
for its new headquarters.

It-is about 400 yards south of 
the present exe’ ange building, 
at Broad and WaU streets.

Cardinal Meyar 
Condition Worsens
CHICAGO (AP) -  Physldana 

today exjuesaed concern over 
the somewhat deteriorated con­
dition of Albert Cardinal Meyer, 
62-year-okl archbishop of Chica­
go, who has develop^ a  blood 
clot in bis left lag. -  «

I S  enevt ST*¡̂

FROZEN FOODS!
BANQUET ArfLE, FEACH, CHERRY, FAMILY SIZE

Fruit Pies*

Macaroni ^  Cheese Casserole......... 6 ,„1.00Baaqoet
I  Oi. Pkg.

Onion Rings
BAKER’S ANGEL FLAKE, 14 OZ.

COCONUT . . . . .  .  63«
HUNTS NO. 3M CAN

TOMATO JUICE . .  2-23«
HUNTS. M OZ. BOTTLE

C A T S U P ...................
I IV ^ m  HALVES OB 8UCED NO. CAN

PEACHES .  .  .  .  .

Chase A Saadora lastaat
n i  i l l  Label
•  Ox. Ja r  .............................................................
m  il t  U b d
If Ox. J a r ...........................................................

...... 97«
1.37

50S&H
GREEN STAMPS

When you purchose sections ll-X of Webster Dictionory or 
sections ll-VIII of the World Book of Science, for only 99̂  
eoch, with coupons!

''None Better Thon The Noturolly Tender, Flovorful Beef ot Piggly Piggly!"

R O U N D  S T E A K  C H U C K  S T EA K
ARMOUR STAR,
AGED, HEAVY BEEF. 
VALU-TUMMED 
POUND............................

ARMOUR STAR.
AGED, HEAVY BEEF. 
VALU-TRIMMED 
POUND...........................

ARMOUB STAR, AGED. HEAVY BEEF. VALU-TRIMMED. 
POUND

SIRLOIN ST EA K ...............79«
ARMOUR STAR. HEAVY REEF. LEAN, BONELESS. POUND
CUBE S T E A K ...................98«

ARMOUR STAR. AGED, HEAW’ BEEF. 
VALU-TRIMMED. ARM BONE CUT, POUND

SWISS STEAK . . . 69«
ARMOUR STAR, A U  MEAT, U  OI. PRC.

FR A N K S ........................... 39«

ROAST

BUTCHER ROY. POUND

SLICED BACON . .
ARMOUR STAR. AGED. HEAVY BEEF. 
VALU-TRIMMED. POUND
RIB ROAST . . .

49«

69«

ARMOUR STAR.
AGED. HEAVY BEEF. 
VALU-TUMMED 
BLADE CUT 
POUND...........................

M IRACLE W HIP 
SUGAR
H O M IN Y

KRAFT
U L A D  DRESSING 
QUART JA R.........

•LB.
BAG

CAMPFIRE 
WHITE OR YELLOW  
NO. 300 CAN ............

V ELV EET A KRAFT'S 
CHEESE FOOD.

-LB.
LOAF

TU N A LUCKY STRIKE 
NO. V\ C A N . . 3i79

H EA LTH  & B EA U TY A/DS.'
CREST, U  OFF LABEL EXTRA LARGE SIZE

T O O T H  PASTE
ASPIRIN ’****”

IC

too Ct. Bottle.
JEANETTE WHITE GLASS, REG. 15f RETAIL

CO FFEE MUG or CEREA L BOW L 8-$1
L o w e s t

p i g

• •

%
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SAIGON, South Viet Nam 
(AP) — Pressing a campaign to 
win the allegiance of the people 
in the Vietnameae countryside 
the Viet Cong are demonstrat­
ing a  homey touch.

Known for their ability to live, 
work and fight on a people-to- 
people level, the Communist 
guerrillas appear to believe 
Uiey have found in the family 
^ t o  album the answer to the 
west’s four-color 
brochures.

Recent secret nuiterial ob­
tained through Vietnamese in­
telligence sources included al­
bums containing pictures of fam- 

gronps, sweethearts, reli- 
ous meetings, funerals and 
litlcal and military gather

propaganda

Uv
fio

New Aircraft Design
A new alreraft design iacerperatlag the best 
ef the beUcopter and the let alrplaie has 
heee desigaed hy the Bell Heliropler Ce.. e( 
Pert Werth, the fina aaaeaaced. This draw- 
lag shews the preposed V/STOL tralHag rotor 
aircraft as It would appear la h e l^ p te r 
fUght, below, and at h l ^  speeds la )e( air-

plane ceaftgaratlaa aheve. Ben 
the plane a “tralnlag retar’ 
helkopter-type rotor blades 
wiag Ups ran be folded hi flight 
positloBs behind streamllaea 
HTREPHOTO)
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Speedy House Action 
Measures Unlikely

Big Horse Race 
Hearing Tonight

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Presl 
dent Johnson's chances of get 
ting House action before Earter 
on three top-prioritv bills ap­
peared today to be improbable, 
if not Imponibie.

The three measures on which 
the President wanted quick pas 
sage are a voting-rights Dili, 
a $1.3 • biUon aid-to-education 
measure, and a proposal for 
comprebensivu beaJth care for 
the elderly.

House leaders who had 
mapped out a  rigid timetable to 
accommodate the President’s 
wishes have aU but tossed it out 
in the face of legislative reali­
ties.

The school measure, first of 
its kind ever passed by the 
House, was sent to the Senate in

a night session last Friday. It Is 
in tM hands of the Senate Fd- 
ucatlon and Labor Conunittee 
which has been friendly to 
school bills in past years.

The health-care Ml] cleared 
the House Ways and Means 
Committee last week but cannot 
go before the Rules Committee 
before 'Tuesday at the earliest. 
Indicatioos were it would not 
receive Rules Committee atten­
tion before Wednesday.

The committee is expected to 
hold a minimum of several days 
of hearings on the complicated 
and cumbersome bill before 
clearing It for House coosldeni- 
tion.

HOUSE DEBATE?
Administration leaders, while 

publicly hoping to get House

debate under way late this 
week, have conceded privately 
that Uie outlook is dark. They 
now plan to vote next wek.

’The voting-rights measure, 
now at the top of the 
list, origioally was scl 
for several days of hearings be­
fore the House Judiciary Com­
mittee. ’The committee already 
has spent more than a week on 
hearings and has witnesses 
a c h e d t^  for four days Uds

The bill then will start its 
tedious Journey through a sub­
committee, then the full Jndld- 
ary group, and finally the Rules 
Committee. There is little likal^ 
hood that it will be in a position 
for House action until after 
Easter.

Plaints, Advice; Problems 
—It's Voice Of Consumer

WASHINGTON (AP) -  While 
taking the pulse of the Ameri­
can consumer, Esther Peterson 
has raised the temperature of 
some top businessmen.

— “The most pernicious 
threat to advertising today,” the 
trade magazine Printers’ Ink 
called her.

— No federal programs, in­
cluding Mrs. Peterson’s, are 
needed to protect consumer in­
terests, said the president of the 
National Association of Manu­
facturers.

— ’’Let’s keep politics out of 
the pantry,” added the chair­
man of General Foods Corp.

HAS ALLIES
But, after a year as the Voice 

of the Consumer in the White 
House, friendly, fast-talking 
Mrs. Peterson hasn’t lost any of 
her energy or enthusiasm. 
Despite the criticism, she has 
plenty of allies In high official 
and business pasLs as well as 
among the consumers. Her 
more formal title is presidential 
assistant for consumer affairs.

“I love being given an assign­
ment in which I believe. I have 
to feel deeply about things I 
do,” says Mrs. Peterson, 59, 
mother of four, who has been a 
labor lobbyist and teacher.

Both the consumer job, for 
which she is unpaid, and her 
$27,000-a-year post as assistant 
secretary of labor are what 
Mrs. Peterson considers areas 
where things can be done "to 
materially improve people’s 
lives.”

HELP CONSUMER
She still thinks she can man­

age to get the business commu­
nity and the consumer together 
voluntarily to change market 
practices and give the consumer 
the information needed "to 
make wise choices in a compli­
cated marketplace.”

President Johnson has shown 
his confidence by recom­
mending a sizeable increase for 
Mrs. Peterson’s consumer office 
in his new budget. The boost, 
from $186,000 to $319,000 for the 
next fiscal year, wouid provide 
for five or six more profession

FROM BODIES
They were taken from Viet 

Cong prisoners and bodies and 
show clearly the degree of or 
ganization that has been 
achieved by the Viet Cong la 
some areas.

Many of the pictures in one 
album were of a religious meet 
ing In ” Phuoc Long d istrict’ 
'This district is believed to cor­
respond roughly to South Viet 
Nam’s official Phuoc 
Province. About 80 miles n 
of Saigon, It Includes the region 
known as ” D” zone, where the 
Viet Cong have found a haven 
for years.

Banners la the pictures pro­
claimed the gathering was a 
“religioo meeting of the Free 
Front of National Liberation of 
Viet Nam.”  ’The liberation front 
is what the Viet calls their 
movement.

Shown in one picture were two 
men in the y^ow  robes of 
Buddhist monks. They were sit 
ting cross-legged on the floor 
with cups of tea in front 
them.

Another picture showed a 
man appam tly  representing 
the Cao Dal, one of Viet Nam’s 
religious groups, who was ad 
dressing the meeting.

Other pictures were of an ap­
parent ^U tical meeting in a 
tent-like structure, where Viet 
Cong f la p  and banners were 
dinilayed. Speakers were shown 
a d o r e ^ g  the audience over 
microphones, while members of 
the crowd raised clenched fists 
la an expression of voting.

MORE MARTIAL
Other pictures were of a more 

martial nature. One showed a 
group of well-equipped troops 
marching with the Viet Cong 
flag flying.

In many of the pictures, the 
subjects wore the black, paja­
ma-type blouse and pants long 
associated with the Communist 
guerrillas. But the marching 
soldiers were in trim, khaki uni­
forms.

One thing they seemed to 
lack, either by choice or by clr 
cumstance, was footwear. All 
the parading troops were bare­
foot.

Informants said the photo al 
bums undoubtedly were used by 
the Viet Cong to show on a per 
sonal level what they claim is 
their way of life. It Is believed 
the albums are passed from 
hand to hand as guerrilla lead 
ers work among the dwellers of 
South Viet Nam’s hamlets and 
vlUaps.

The campaign Is low key. but 
people who follow such work 
closely believe it is effective.

AUSTIN. Tex. (AP)~Texas 
leMslators indulge today in pos­
sibly the session's last big com 
rnlttse show—a hearing on the 
Texas Racing Association’s bill 
to legalize pari-mutuel horse 
race betting.

House officials will be ready 
with extra sergeants at arms 
and chairs to handle the expect­
ed large crowd anticipated for 
the House State A ffan  Com 
mittee hearing (at 7:30 p.m ).

STUDENT LOANS
In other action today. Rep. 

George Hinson of Minema plans 
to seek further House action on 
a proposal to establish a $79 
million college student loar 
fund. Senators approved the 
proposal, but Hinson must de­
cide whether to accept the $29 
million Senate cut in the fund.

’The racing association has

HUNTSVILLE, Ata. (AP) -  
Authorities say Joseph C. Dw 
Lashmitt Jr. apparn tly  fired 
fatal bullets into the bodies of 
his wife and two children, told a 
telephone operator what he had 
done, and tiwn shot himself.

The 3^year•old employe of 
Brown Engineering Co., one of 
this space city’s largeet firms, 
died in Huntsville Hospital wlth- 
in 19 minutes after his wife 
Joan, 31, and eon, John, I, p e r 
ished from gunshot wounds nun 
day.

His 3-year-old daughter. Joy, 
died late Sunday night hi the
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called on several out-of-staters 
to help present their case to­
night: form«- Kentucky Gov 
Bert Combs; David Novlck of 
Santa Monica. CaUf., associa­
tion with the Rand Corp.; and 
J. Spencer Drayton of New 
York, executive vice presldeni 
of the Thoroughbred Radng 
Protective Bureau.

LOCAL OPTION
Rep. Maurice Pipkin of 

Brownsville is spons« of the 
bUl, which would create a horse 
racing commission and provide 
for local option elections to 
decide w beth« to allow race 
track betting.

Opponents probably will in­
clude a representative of the 
Cttlsens Against Race Track 
Gambling, whose formation was 
announced o w  the weekend. E 
B. Germany, former president 
of Lone Star Steel Ce., is one 
of 13 businessmen who have 
fomaed the group’s executive 
committee. Jonn McKee of Dal­
las, regional m anag« of civic 
affairs for Ford Motor Co., 
chairman of the group.

Stock Market 
Opens Higher
NEW YORK (A P)-The stock 

market opened high« hi active 
trading today.

Gains usually were small.
On favorable nesrs on thelr 

nroposed m erg«, New York 
Central roee % to 17% and 
Pennsylvania RaOroad was nn- 
chang^ at 47%.__________

OPEN HOUSES
Wosson PI. Ktnfrwood Addition
O ffk e  3700  Ln Ju n te  AM  3 ^ 3 3 1

•  3 Bedrooms #  2 Pull Corom ic Botfco
•  C ontrol Hoot A Air

MOVE IN TODAY
•  No Down Poymont

•  N o Closing Cost

WE TAKE TRADES
W I H A V I KINTALS

LLOYD F. CURLEY, Buildor

hospital. 
Neii

MRS. ESTHER 
Raprasants th a  "voice

PETERSON 
of th e consum er

(AP wieepHOTO)

Attacks Made 
On Consulate
BONN, Germany (AP) — ’The 

West German Foreign Office 
says bomb attacks were made 
Saturday on a branch of the 
West G «m an Embassy and the 

in Ml

Presidential Guord 
Funds Requested
WASHINGTON (AP) -  Soc- 

re u ry  of the Treasury Douglas 
Dillon has asked Congress to 
spend $4 mlUlon more providing 
protection for presidents.

DiUon made his plea before a 
House A p p r o p r ia t io n s  subcoin 
mittee diuing a dosed meeting 
Feb. 15. The transcript w u  
made public Suoday.

<

als on her staff.
The President gave this ap-

Sraisal of Mrs. Peterson, whom 
e has known ior years;
"She never backs awiy from 

an assignment because It Is dif­
ficult or demandirg. She’s int«- 
ested in getting to the core of a 
problem and finding the most 
constructive course, to make 
progress.”

Mrs. Peterson’s first reports 
and recommendations as the 
nation’s consumer advisor, are 
currently In the White House, 
awaiting presidential approval 
and publication. They sum up

Two Perish 
In Accident
EUNICE, La. (AP)—Two p « - 

sons were killed and two others 
were injured Sunday in a two- 
car crash five miles east of 
here.

'The dead were Goldman J . 
Manuel, 80, <a Jefferson Parish, 
and Mrs. Hazel Green Mill«, 
92, of Houston, Tex.

The Injured were Arthur B 
Miller, 53, husband of the wom­
an, and Mrs. R ob«t Green, 74, 
also of Houston, t  p tsseng«  In 
IlM MlU« car.

what she has learned from talk­
ing to all sides.

ADVICE COMES 
After asking for them, com 

plaints, advice and problems 
poured in on Mrs. Peterson 
from consumers. One woman 
enclosed a broken cold cream 
jar, revealing a heavy, content- 
concealing bottom. Anotb« sent 
the wrapper from a frozen din­
ner, picturing two thick slices of 
meat. She said it contained just 
one thin slice.

The post office had no trouble 
delivering one letter addre.ssed;

‘”rhat Woman President 
Johnson Appointed to Look Aft- 
er the Consum«. Washington. 
D.C.”

When her opponents among 
the Madison Avenue advertising 
men, such as Mark E. Coop«, 
president of the Advertising 
Federation of America, said she 
had created "unwarranted aus-

Scion of American business.” 
ra. Peterson noted: "You do 

not stir an empty kettle.”

P r t B i d e n t  R«lox«s
In Cotoctin Hilli
WASHINGTON (AP) -  Presi­

dent Johnson relaxed Sunday at 
Camp David in the (^toctin 
Mountains of western Maryland 
The President and Mrs. Johnson 
flew to the camp by helicopter 
Saturday night and returned 
late SuDdax m oinK .

US. consulate in Benghazi. 
Libya. No one was injured, a 
spokesman added.

It was the third attack on a 
West German mission in an 
Arab nation since Bonn an­
nounced it would seek diplo­
matic relations with Israel.

Freighter Sinks 
After Sea Crash

FOLKESTONE, E n g l a n d  
(AP) -  The 1.056-ton West G «  
man freighter Katharina Kolk- 
mann sank a f t«  a collision to­
day with the 923-ton British 
freighter Gannet in the English 
Channel.

Rescuers picked up 14 of the 
Katharina's crew, one man was 
missing.

E. German Family 
Flees To Freedom
BERLIN (AP) -  An East 

G «m an couple and their throe 
children tore their way through 
barbed wire shortly before 
dawn today and escaped to West 
B«Un.

Nin«t««n Raportfd 
Dtad In Roil Crash
RIO DE JANEIRO, Brazil 

(AP) — Nineteen persons were 
reported killed and S3 injured 
e« ly  today when a com m ut«i’ 
train craMwd Into a  derailed 
Ireiglit train.

eighbors could give no ex 
planatlon f «  the shooting, 
which occurred In DeLaMiinltrs 
fashionaUe $30.006 brick home 
In a quiet section called Sh«- 
wood Pork. A landlord said De- 
Lashmitt seemed “like a real 
happy man.”

Bids On Bonds 
To Be Opened
GARDEN CTTY-Blds wffl I 

received and opened tonight i 
a mMting of the Glasscock 
County Independent School dle- 
trict board of trustees for the 
ttle  of $179,000 in school bonds 
voted by the district Feb. M.

The lO-year general obligation 
bonds, when aold, will provide 
funds tor new elementary class­
rooms, auditorium improve­
ments, revamped heating tya- 
tem In the high school, improviad 
lighting system in the eWmen- 
tary school and o th «  remodel-

last construction. Involv­
ing bonds, at the school plant 
was in 1837 when the high school 
was built. Tbe present elemen­
tary school w u  built in 1130.

Traffic Group 
To Meet Tuesday
A recommendation from the 

police department tor fatality 
markers in tbe d ty  and discus­
sion of removal of parking from 
the n o r t h  ride of Fifteenth 
Street, between Scurry a n d  
Main, are among items to be 
considered by the traffic com­
mission at 3:30 p.m. 'Tuesday in 
d tv  hail.

On the agenda also are a dis­
cussion of traffic controls at 
Second and Gregg, and traffic 
sight hazards on com «s In the 
city.
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To See Film
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SSÛ8PŜ $T

SPACE ADS 
ear «n m eay «atimi,

4 -a  a m  e a a c a o iN o  o a v  
ear twwtwf wwmmk, t.m  e ta .

ertaay.
CANCELLATIONS

If year ww la «aaeame iam w  « •  
atraaiaa yaa ara caaraaa aaly far 

aar at iay« a  raa.
ERRORS

eiaam aatity aa af aay arrara «  
«act Wa caanaf a« r«ie«aiw ii m  
arran  Wwfwwt taa arat m y.

PAYMENT
M earafy a i  wi aa- 
mW paymaaf 1« aaa

Carfani 
caania.«
m# aaa limar« 

clataify i 
*a  Ctay.

at wwt

DIAL AM 4-4331

BUSINESS
DIRECTORY

AMO

j j w i a i M i a n g - Mni
iUiVBÛWffr H O W f  A W ' B W W r
m  Warm ormm AM *4m*

u f V k i  n i n i i -

RIAL ISTATI T

BUSINESS PROPERTY A-1

LIMI eon tola— oacm AM *4» ar AM PtHW
HOUSES FOR SALE 
1 è e ò S ò A irffó M k  - ~ l â w

A4

wm
•Y  OWNIN■H — I  fetweam«. t

J S a B „
aaam. Alfar |:0t AM

LEGAL NOTICE

"The Good Old Days,” a h 
nun  interest film for the na­
tional program of the heart as­
sociation, will be screened at 
7:30 p.m. Monday for the How­
ard County Heart Association. 
'The film features p lay«s who 
appear In television’s "Donna 
Reed Show.”

All members of the associa­
tion are urged to be at the 
Malone and Hogan Clinic Libra­
ry at 7:30 p.m. for the meeting 
Dr. Donald Terry, president, 
will presMe. Bo Bowen Is the 
secretary.

Fire Breaks Out 
On Cargo Vessel
NEW YORK (AP) -  Fire 

broke out today in the engine 
room of the cargo ship Leda 
Maersk. and was b ro u ^ t und« 
control in le u  than an hour. 
There were no injuries.

Returned Here
Robert CYayton, wanted here 

for enticing a minor, w u  re­
turned to Howard Coun^ Jail 
Sunday by Bill Whitton, (leputy 
Whitton took "ustody of the pris­
o n «  in Tavkfr, where he had 
been apprMmdcd on a local 
,«aznoL
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ukk
Bs£  Stauy ............  AM 4-7268
Edna G ooch............ AM 34055
Nova D e a n ..............  AM 3-2450
VIEW

Baduty
. . H1GHLAND SO . . .. . IM« hama h« avarymirm, 

i l r i p i a ci  m m  WWW» en a rm  «a  a  4V panal dan B kit, taaciaua «irtii bar . . . atananty gm bifring bt «riM car-
aantry 4 W baih lalm dbla aar . . . ) ift b«mi i  I alaaniing «mi fñ« baw»t an Iba aaufb «ring . . Offy earpaf, tualam dmpm liral uattnga B ya «rg gnxMwa la rntmm U. . . cMI m

W*ORDS FAIL ME . . .
ta  U muM C . . . fhit •pac T rm Rama 
. . . bril bamf m A l cMtd ibru auf. 
Obla gar, pmpla aig . . . tnrd yd. axira 

wl . . . Irada «ifiat u  nava fm
U

u n  MdWaan, AM

HAVI RRÀRtRTY m itr'aáa for praaàrfy k 
arta. Tax« Writa P.

Ila  Iprln t. WM 
Higbmia Lama 
•aa  « I .  Itinga-

R R e m e iV  lawn « i4 Imiim  Avian 1 badraama, «wM»t, « m il «mrk Miep, Aiarao« •baS.̂  Udriwa m*c«4. 
w«m« w«R aaUbii« ««  orniy M ram ^  
tra««. fW wm e a«  e i  Laén. •aymanf* 
MI. HO» Canary, AM 34M4.

POR B m  RESULTI . . 
USE HERALD WANT ADS

GRIN AND BEAR IT

u

GREEN 'THUTUB___ ?
A ggrdanar't poradi«« an WxriM ft. m, ) bdrmt, r-i baft», axtrg gaad wait af «mar, pricad la tail naar, IWJM

ASSUME PHA LOAN . . .
MM a«m a  pmit Ml . . . «tapa faOaHaa teb 4 Igt rma, ll«.rm • ball carpafad Duefaa ww. tingla gar. yda bica. Laan Mri artly IT4M . mw tadav.

BEAUTY SHOP . . . BLDG k
tmrtw . . , « I  m  luat nSM . . . aatv mm*.

BUY A DREAM . . .
Mama m  tUAM . . .  1 «poclaua bs-m i,Iga claaafv tw baifia . . . dan . . . amiami carpal. Drapat . . afava- rtfrlg wotbar ara Ntetudad .' . . Obi Or., carpart . . tla baaulmaelaua yd. Vgeanfrinaut In laaay.

YOURS FOR 81,000 DWN . . .
b« . . . lual IIAJM . . . • bdrma I praNy balbt . . . Ipc-Kv-rtn taina dan witb flrapMca . . . eampact ala< kit . . . alta carpafad a drapad . . . Tbia brk hM baan raducad far immad tola. 
C balara t »  RM

LOVELY OLDER HOME . . .
an RunnaH . , 

. 3 b « m t
« I rma Ma a  iivaWa 

3 lull balbt Cani, 
baat . . .  air cana . . ewrwm-Wrwwtw. 
Obla wm, «M  win ban«#

COMMT . . BLDG k  LOTS . . .
I  ebaka bidga rtducad . . .  a  raat
«olu« an mit cbaica cam tr Itf. . .

9 RM HOME . . ,
•atb  . . . dudad air . . .  Ma lei . .  . 
fruit t r a «  . . . rhaica iRet bttwaan Sr. 
•  Jr HI. AM m  • •« • .

WASHINGTON PL . . .
Lga batna B dbi gar m  MSM . . .  Man 
ovdllabla . . . La antlk.

4 BDRMS . . 2 BA'THS . . .
tUAM . .  a  buy tor THR tcananty 

tomiiy . . . Ruity coTRatad . . . Lga 
kitMtn cambiiwtlan . . . n a «  tebt.

YOUR $3 WILL GO . . .
tortbar at Rbeadi Rtolly . . . W t'rg 
Rraud al aur Sarvlea 1  LHtingt , . .  
can AM 344« . . .  AM 4-TlM .  .  .  
AM 340U. _____

Shelly
AM 44781

Helen
1211 Mala St.

A «  3 »  
NSAR TOWN--A uMt ageitmanl bauatk 
eamRHialy bimitbaa. tilAMw 
ANORfWS MKHIWAV-4 ktaraim a, RaM 
m i al a a lr«  Ra« Buy ttlA tB  
OASIS ACReV-Naw 3 • iW iam. aMCWM 
«rill int. an 3 aerea.
COMMRRCiAL-mm m  w m  am ara«  
«aWNM. Wnanead. 13H B. 4M.

t « i  Salim.
ACRBAM eOR SAL&'

RAI.A. a  V A  R se o e .
m n  Ra«ban AM 4-THr

*'Aftor 6 nmtím of

V



NO DOWN 
PAYMENT
C M hk Cast 0«tT

Thos. J.
McADAMS

Builder
pMciy KdM Ucd. 

t lS J I  MtvM Ym  ta

AM 4-294S 
afln rhM n AM 4-«72 

AM S 4 m  •  AM 4-MN 
1602 M A ICY— FM 700

0 « M IR  TRAMSMIMIHM -  1 
r«*M. t  M «

4

«M î wiii M» I
m t  CACTUS . . .

N«w S iM lrM a. hath A % 
Brirk. L'UWy raMi. taurice 
deeNe om ixe C atlw inl 
cciliaB, ItiiiB  raaai. 4c 

Nrkca cawhiaattaa. Re- 
frlaaraled air. Extra Nica 
A l  aacaal Haaie.

Ä . 1 MéraM -«M. ana I M 4 t. Mr.

FARM A RANCI LOANS 
OPEN 7 DAYS WEEK

SAM L  lURNS 
REAL ESTATE

S S n  A CAROL DRI>'E 
AM 447«

D. L. Aaida. AM S-«7S 
Milas Waa4. AM 4S7» 
Saas Baras, AM I 4 m

«S  E . 4tk AM 4SSM
CMOICa LOCATMM. 1 4 * .

C41.VM»—J

H c a o a o .
tm n

rr. M m tm  I kr^m u. «Ml
uuMa

MM ••

NIGHT CALLS
4M ItiM

R IA L ISTA TI A
BOUSES FU I SALE A-t

m  ANN . . .
Nr« S hedraant, i \  batfe, 
kMrkra • dea • UviaR raa«  
raariliaaltaa. Brirk. Cratral 
krat A a I r  raadHiaaR, 
feacr. Claac to srkaal.

WESTERN HILLS AREA
i BrdraaaM. 14  katka, 
raaiDirtriv rrkaiR. Rra- 
aaaabiy priead.

REAL ESTATE
HOUSES FOR SALE

McDonald-
McCleskey

« * 4 m  AM M B7
Office AM 4«15 

Mldweat Bklg 611 Mata

RENTALS
FURNISHED APTS.
} ounaxds-ONa

B-t
__ ____IriMW, MS.
0*H«a. a4«l. CsM 4 
».m.

) ^s-iS
Ml MONTH-) ROOM 

WIN
n. WMOMI Mm l
II #r MRUMi  A«. 
e « «  T4M.

TWO. THRCa.

s a a  u s  COR o c r ic e  scA ca,
4M  VA RaCOSSaSSIONX

CHA

TWO aaoRooMS—*1
« •  ACRCS ORAtSLANO, • « )

T N aaa  aaOROOMt. t  RMO«. Mn. Mncal 
r4. U««4 M I  mm. — v tn  4mm  m4f sne M4.

aaAUTV RARtOR — M RMM 4*
MxM. 4 dtalr«. Cm  4« mswM R 4mttrt4
RICH OR ROOR. VM CM t afMrl N 
M kwv HM HvMkM ATTRACTIVC 4 
)  4 l lrn M  k4m* M  H  4Mcfc wN4 t  r«M

YOU CAN DRAW INTaRRST M  mmmi 
m4 M  NtM 4 k a m ., S kaRi. M 
V SWJM. WM NMt.

ATTRACTIva OLOaa HOMS. S t  
MM. m  4«Nm. RNMa n w n . mm rw 

Rraptaw.
aaoROOMS. s u d in o  o cass  omt* 

. lar mum eawarM m N4. cm NM 4m I 4 
4tr. tm tr n . mc4U. CMR.. IM*. law «rmNv.

WATER HEATERS 
SS-Gai. lAYr.. Gtaaa Ltoad

$47.97
II

P. Y. TATE 
M  Weal Tkird

Mvwiw coNCRara rita  suMnni kuNo Mr • iNi S
aU .aN  R2ZRU. ....................... AM 4-NHN azzRi.
COCOia ROilNSON
R a o e v  MARSHALL JOa MORRITT .......
SUBURBAN A-l
TWO I ACM «rad i a « «  i f  cHy. 
AM 44SM.
Roa SALS-) RCT44. IV4 mNm in 
44 IMM. SMS 4W4 4R I  «W 
Rkarw CX 441N.

REAL ESTATE
HOUSES FOR SALE

MARY SUTER
IMS LancasterAM 4^11

O J II  -  )  aORMS 
WarR> Mart — Cm 4 
NO NCCO TO RtNT 
Rrt Mtwta iMMat. IS « t 
ta m M Maa) raaatra aa 
kv Mr Mat.

aORM HOMR

SlU arkaa

SRAUTIRUL ) 
aaM a  iiMtrk 4  Ora

DISTRICTRARXHILL SCH
Í m Í * —" A t”  CLàAJt 
) aOM. oarpart. NmR Niaa. taacaa yarO. 
h o m i  4  ) RM ART.
Lr* kaOr

RENTALS
BKDR(N)MS
•eOROOM, R R I^A ta

IIM. AM MNS.
N ica  LARoa

Saa M4
STATI HOTRL —

RTYOMINC HO TtL- CItaa. 
fatata. TV. Raa aarklaa Watkty ratta 
S74S aaR 4R. RMcfia SataaR. Mrt
la ro !  NICÉLV MrattMaR kaRrat

A stia oatM. c  to 4R
i  ROAM 4RICX-AN aw .. SMJH.

LIFE-HOSPITAI^AUTO
fc HOME INSURANCE

BUYING 
OR SELLING

MRY

tSSdM
TOTAL PRICE

2 Bedroom House—East I4th St. 
Needs Paint Top Location.

CALL AM 440* 
____For Key._____

MCE 3 BEDROOM

SRt¿IAL w eaxL V  rataÄ 
Ml aa  az. ty kMck aarRi
FIRNLSHED APTS.
NlCRLT RURNISHCO

14
Mr I ar t

t  ROOM RURNISHCO _  
aaa R «at paM S «  C a«  IIRl AM 44147
ARARTMRNT — SRURNISMCO

T m i  ar AM 44ISI.____________
SMALL ARARTMRiA . kartrawa ~

AM ASII7

RROCCORATRO D U R lIX -a  cR 
Mr aaW. ANa garaRt « a rla i 
Raaa aaraattrt« awicaata. SM AM mfm.
dow ntow n  -  1 RURNISHCO 
ana kaSraaai aaR t  kakriwa. A 
AM ASIS4.

ANNOUNCEMENTS
LODGES C-I

^ t l D  CONCLAVI •  I a  
S a tW  C aav ttea irv  Na. Si IC 

- -  TTMaaSav. Mardt » ,  7 ;»  a. 
i R G Y  Caa«arrMa OrRw «  KaMHt 
I m B R  «  MalM Air sir KnIaMt u r ia l 

M alMal
c. a.w a.

STATIO

McClaaiw, a. C 
StllMaa, Rac

—r- JL  RMt«« t o  f \  ana AM.
MaiTW«
awarv I
>tô fW«a

AR.
7 ;»  p ja

Air

The Carituo Houaa
m m m  4  UraurftttNaa ARM.

•iRwMta 44 , C a y « . O 
CmNa  WatRart. OryarArv

MM Marev Or AM SAISI

Poaderoaa Apartinaoto
New Addition Available Now

I, 2, 2 bedroom furniahad or « •  
fumtaked apartmeots. Cantral 
heat, carpet, drapec, «flRtas 
paid, TV Cable, carporta, ra> 
creatloa room and waMiatarU 

blocks from CoUece Park 
Shopping Cantor.
AM 34311 1421 East fOi
CLIAN )  aOOM luraWMl 
eauMi. I »  m r inaaM, tta  
IM l a «  Z M . AM m tm  m

Kentwood Apartmenta 
1904 E. 2Sth AM 46444

Big Spriag’t  Neweat Apta.
Bedroom from |1U -|1« ; 

Bedroom from HM. AD atUR 
paid, includei TV Cabla aO 
apu .; comptotaiy 
draped, w aM w r-dr^ i 
all electric kttchens, 
swimming pooL naa 
center.
UNFURNISHED APTS. B4

T.
MIKRtN, WJA. 
MarrM, Sac.

sra 4 I
C A L L a D MIRTINO Ri« SaHne OtaRMr Na. IM R A M toia^. Awn L 7;» Rjn.

CUSTOM
UPHOLSTERY

R. O. Rrawaw, H R.
IrvM  Oawl«. Sac.

C X L L I O  MIRTINO RM 
Sariaa LaRRk Na. ISM A.R 
a to  AAIL. M aalav. Mardi 

■ ■ I «  7;SS Wars
O aarto VW-

A  a to  AJA.. Matoav. 
_  _  »Ri. Laaaa m m  «  7;|

Iwi^wSoimt"* ****'*
N. O. R rator, WA4.
A. J. AHaa,

SPECIAL NOTICES
u L u f«  imaaiNa
ryr AM 4ÍÍ41  RrH

RABBITS FOR SALE 
AD Good Mixed Breeding 

Stock. FrYers — Abo 
EASTER BUNNIES 
Til WILLA STREET 

After I  P.M. Waakdayi 
Anytime On Stadaya

eW R O R R A rfi? CLINIC -  Ö S Ü  
Ckram. S a M  X-Ray aaaly«i. Mwir- 
—ça casa» .aocaalto  w T ia i r v ,.  Ar-

CÒLO aoNcT' kt

PERSONAL 0 6
issL’w r . ' í a . T á r ^

* 2 9 ”
Upkabtered Safa WO/A 

Cbaice IN Malcrtab
tokk ■« tiin iM -  Rick-ua «M

ONK-OAY SERVICE
-4mm  w ars o iiia T  c a «  H R ar

AM 34344 3 tll W. Hwy. «

6-B Big Spring (Taxos) Herald, Mon., March 29, 1965
INSTRUCTION

Wanted ! !
MEN-WOMEN-COUPLES

Ovar M M NaM Mr
Motel Managers

Sliart kiatiatnalva cauna «  ham# ML 
latwa to  Rractic« Trainkia M a Molar 
Hato iMfitto a to  tR tr« to  kv tw. Hi«i
Seto« alucMIan It iwt wacMtary

Riaca tttt«  attItMnea la Htata au«>-
^  4 p trportan« IMarvlatr twMo plv- 

acttfpalMn a to  pkona Na. M:

PLASTIC PIPE
;laM R.V.C 4  4R KMto 
SpacM Mra 4prR )
8  M .-S l.n  P «  Ml R.

RkR Raly-RI 
■ « ra  

M I
V«vM OWr.

I M. ar
CO.-4M a . IRMa« 
CaNad MU 44471

EMPLOYMENT
HELP WANTED, Male
WANTRO-CXRCRICNCIO 
iMtnian. Can RI 7 -pm  D«l 
k t to i tn 7:SI a-at.-4:iS p.m.
HELP WANTED, Feam b F t
HAVI ORININO Mr I  ar )  Tiiapw 
awra OaaMrt Mr part Mma «  to l  Hnta. 
Rar MMrmallan caN AM 4HI7.

START a  na« a ip  Monty M Ilia Sank 
It a  re «  awrry kUMr. a to  r y  aaay 
M J « .  Wrtta Avaa Mrt.. Sai 4141 
MMMto. Ttaat.

HELP WANTED, Mbc. F4

BUSINESS OP.____________ p
ROR t A ie  — Orivalw pracary m imatl 
totoRMa e« to r. Maw Rna Mto a to  
caMiaa. (XtokkM Oaea. Tana*. M t«
•w ctuWt RaannakM CaR HI >M7S 
W rto MSS Wo« SRI S tra«. CMca. Tm ih

N ica. e u l iT  t
I aaW. t n ,  1 

CaN AM 47)14.

R  RNISHED HOUSES B 4

MUST SELL 
I  LEAD CLAIMS

aCDROOM tolRNISNRO to Ornm m Wo« ZM. AM ««71•"•"M wtdM7*OfMrf Sat mÜToIm"

BK SPRING 
EMPLOYMENT 

AGENCY
RIMALI

toCRRTAR Y - g  M M.â f̂ ïdlt̂ tt t̂atâ tll̂ il

JlOOM^tolItolM»
THRRI a a o a o o M . ww saRt. 

Set MrnRitr« waMiw an 
tettoia, su a  I

Mardi MM «  
I. Taw arawnwi.

SALRS-M M a  inatto a to  au to to  ta to  
tnpw. i t o  artM a  M v r a .........  licHM nl

AM S-gPl. BUSINESS SERVICES IOS Permlaa Bldg.

laacultva Traintna DIvttlan 
AMRASSAOOR A40TRL4, INC. 

«I. B IMS AHtoa l ir a «
>1)

FOR BEST RESULTS . . 
USE HERALD WANT ADS

CASH LOANS 
ON SHOTGUNS, 
DEER RIFLES B 

REVOLVERS 
F. Y. Tata Pawa Skep 

IIN  Weat Tkird

FINANCIAL
PERSONAL LOANS

MILITARY 
Quick Laa ytm.

RIRSONNCL-Laan SM
Sarvica, M  Runnal«

WOMAN'S COLUMN
CONVALESCfNT HOMR. Ra 
ar too Ixpartancad car« 
Mr». J. L. Unaw

n ip  Main,

CUSTODIAL NURSINO Hwto, «07A wm.

i o i e
Phone, tell us how 
m u c h  m oney  you  
n e e d  to m e e t  all 
your seasonal  ex­
penses. Take up  
to 3 6  m o n t h s  to 
repay. Do It now!

X BwU
iJ4^ M

a
1112.50 
274.90 
506.71 
750.85 

1197.52 
1495 04

16.00
19.00

$2700
39.00

$01»
54.00

Tkk tkavt

LOANS $100 a $S00 a $900 a $1400 AND UP

COMMUNITY
FINANCE CORPORATION 

of Big Spring
106 East Third S tre e t........................AM 4  5234

Serving the people of Texas for over 18 years!

UNOf •  NIW 
UttaHigB pai«.

S N J» m X * w a« L
AM MPTl g g  W . Hl|

RAY'S RUMAItto  Sarytea. cataatoM, 
Rc Mato ptwtpto. to d ttn a  CaMP 

«•c «ato n a to  Rap. AM «ISM.
'tXRffRIRNCaO RRfSSRR Ktn't
Havr Marttnittna ZMt OraRR Stn

r t  T T  A r a j w T f c T
RRRTILIZIR. 
tana, t o t  m«»It

TOR a to  to 'N S fO  SIVRRAL

CLIAN. ATTRACTIVI )H  
laaMR otniar. S s j na atto 
nca«w , AM M W

LL RURNISHRO kMto. 
Wto aaM fM  S g lS  w

CLOCK RRRAIRIMO — AR nial 
patrto «  raatonaRM anca«  R to't 
Kay Snaii W  RaM TMrK, AM

n«a cNy toacM ry. Na ttNMR. yVrNa Baai 
R-M7 cara «  4«p tpriwR HwaM_______'

AM «7RM.

H O M E -B Y  OWNER 
SA.ND SPRLVGS

NRyyiY ORCORATRO — 4 
n n k t«  wtvaM Pato. «tRNtaR >MT

RURNISHRO 4 ROOM
STS ataato. I ar t  ckRRrm

TOR SOtU 
Meto, artvai
• a n  rad o . . ____
c u a rto  Ray. AM 4 7 P 4

p tw rn o N  W A m n ),
AM SCCKINC rwmm 
mam awtv a to  aww

4 :»  M

F6

AM « M «
TOR SOIL a to

S L A W a toTMMiSttoO ARARTMeNIR-

B ?r% .T S R «T le
RaSm a in —t  kaatat
a n rg  »  a  to  RM» «

M aif larMR. Tto 
nato SwM pay Mr 
ta lraa»-M H I N

)  ROOM OURLIX. M14 MatoL IM fnwto. 
r awR. to  paM. AM 4g7S

VARIOUS-« RIOROOM M ratofR katoa 
naw Rata. S4Sr w « ty  ) raam to rn tto to

r>
NR »ato OMI Ä ~L . 
AM « t u «  AM ««14t.

RURNiruRR STRIRRINO a to  RiWiilto
IXCRRTIOMALLV NICR « I; «
a« to . U t i i t  La«salt

raani Mmttnto kavaa. STS. AM 4-«Ht

Slaughter !M
If Intaretted CaH All 4 -tM _
MOROOM. RRICR Wtm. aaw e»M»Ri

nMto'̂ AM Tt4»f V 'ami

NICILV RURNISHRO aaart 
aaM. Maty t o  IIM RMca.

CLIAN 1 MOROOM MmKhto iMaaa. 
MS manto, na kMl paW. toRtoa «  
Mil Wa« 4to

Mg Sarvica naw k«nR aMarto «  Lav' 
am im i «  R a« H W » « t  AM « « 1
fiiÖÖR WAX INO.

HALMMAY HOUSR Sarvica RnMrprttH . 
man r ta to  M a» maat any « k  aa a  
mkniM*» natica, wm nark an kaar w  
a  manto. AM S-MIL

CLIAN. OUIRT. naakv 
4 raamt MmtttoR. kMM | 
AM «TIM.

RURNISHRO CLIAN S rawn 
tara* cMitt i .  Mca Mtm. acca«

^O O R  WAXINO. t o l » ^  «
âSôm.*' mSLmrto — *GL - -***̂  —-

I Sarvte« AM

POSITION WANTED, P. F 4
DAY WORK, Ra

«aw
WANT TO 
III Kam M

ìpbmm^'^écIi up U 
4 awrm. CaH MM t*/»

•  WRECKER SERVICE •
DAY OR
AM 4-7424

NIGHT AND 
HOLIDAYS

AM 4-8321

S O O  W .  4 H i AM 4-7424

IW  Gregg AM 4-2111
ALDERSON REAL ESTATE

CpectecuUr view, 4 bedroome 
^  3 beths plus eD desired fee

ICLRAN 1 MOROOM Raatoi Mrato»R. 
HR«A Uaoato. AM MSI) w  AM «44S«

RURNISHRO t MOROOM
Mvrwê ^̂ w *eŵ«MP ww

CITY ORLIVtRV-RttofW y t o M ii, ^  

w r a t  AM M e t  AM « » S t

AM 4-2M7 
AM 4-2244 
AM460K

1716 Scurry 
JueelU Conway 

Dorotky Herbnd

ture» el a mcrtfloa price. 
4 HlgUeed Hcatker • High­
land So.

t h r u  ro o m  MnMtRto
IvrnitktM. IM m anto 11 

ry. Apaly 111) Mato. AM «T Sa

OMtefirrev — tixtomino -  TapSi I R««kÌR Ani tto Ito CaR AM sSllf I
PURNISHRO TWO StW ttm  Ha 
am. « t a t «  arattor cannaett 
R ito  AÑÍ to r n  ar AM tU T l

tm ^ T R a CTiMO c r m c n t
ito in i. AM )-»«L

««Somtthing Ntw 4«

LIAN ROOM
NW wit« 4to L

GOOD HRICNRORt40O0.

RCDROOM HOMI, to n ttl to  
tpRma ctntw . i l l  l a «  UM.

HARORAvd RRRRiOf î Î T  
anp itnH c« an^ni^tan 
•an. Oaya AM ««7t1

ON -  
an »lima » I  
HI»«» AM «

AnoHier C able C konnel b riags you color progroms. 
Cablo C kannol 6  —  ABC Notwork

QUALITY t  «R A C I-avw  tJM  t o  R at RMt k»k««to krick 
to a  k itton  
I cwnaL I  
aa  1 acra

H ' Ä  ï i - .  a  «  Ä Ä ' ö r* ” Ust of 71 Real Bovs. vari-|t«i. tautn »»trimt«. am ««n

R U rr HO M O R R -l 
•aa R I Carnato«
Wa fa to  lärm«
INVITINO SURU 
krica t am alNit. carp « to  ) 
Iw a t aa  ilactric kMton. PM

oes locetloiis. aD price rang-h room RuR«iSM<rê n »rtmiM. wRt
0GÉ4. B88 $*t ÔMFGBBBN.

CUT! RRRiCieNCV ap 
Jvnlar Catoaa. SM m g« 
a a to  «¡vy Oiwpa. CaR
AM M t l l

urn pata,« c ria r L G. HUDSON

• RURNISHRO. RXtRAiM c«
W  e a sy  io own -  no cash re-iRÑMto o«« to n « ^  

*  quired. leese-porchase plan ÏSn« ^atoraa t ?
3/2 4 4/2 bricks ta Km I- ïl-

RCAUTIRUL YARO-Mara k  
tprln» enck  ) 

carp«, I  cwanMc kPRk. kuRt kit-Ran. 
alactric kaMMa, RM. Raragt ttZM tu«
aauny

piirdue—Urge 3/2 brick ta per- 
^  feet conditioa Lendsciped 

carpeted, draped — Better 
Look.

ATTRACTIVt I  MOROOM. , ^  
catoWianto. carpan, ttarap«  «aneto yarR. 

AuRurn. AM 4441« AM «M S.

I. "m m toflat 
Lkicatn a to  I4SI 

A LMicaki Can AM «IKM w  am 4-Mg

ROR RRHT-4 raam turnlikaP kauai 
toaRpma cantw. in 
AM *JU* w  AM «7R71.
t  ROOM RURNISHRO 
Iw pt 1 raam Mrnitoto 
kuk »444 AM 4 W «

Top Soil — FID Dirt — Fertfllaer 
— CatcUw Send — Driveway 
Gravel — Asphalt Paving.

AM 4-5142

Yom enjoy omiw color wiHi o Coblo hookup 
CALL AM 3-6302 FOB A CABLE CONNECTION

H O M E
B E A L  E S T A T E

165 Permlan BIdg AM 34663 
Lee Hans -  AM 4-M19 

Marie Price -  AM 3-4129 
Ifrs Jeff Brown -  AM 4-6230

COLONIAL—Antigua Rnck HOMI Rfnry 
kaH laaRt ta  to rn ita  KNton. 1 k «m . } 
kam. Daukia pw a to  utwitv rm wtM 
a tta «  vR. tncU  . . . SM W  iKtia cato 
will

Pr i c e d  
I n t e

to move now! Extra 
2 bedroonv—Make Of­

fer. 902 BIrdweD
lot of room — 1660 aq. ft 

only 975 mo 1902 llth  PI 
No cash required, paint for 
down payment

Big Sprtag’s Finest

DUPLEXES

peposM ssed Homes ! ! Both 
FHA 4  VA—RK) down pav-
ment and some are extra 
good buys.

| \ n  You Have Real Estate 
Prohlem.s’ Need to huv or 
sell’ You will like the wav 
we do business.

2 Bedroom Apartments 
Furnished or I’nfurnbhed 

Air conditioned • Vented Heat 
Wall-to-Wall Carpet (Optional)' 
Fenced Yard-Garage 4  Storage

1507 SYCAMORE 
AM 4-7861 

RuaNiSMZO AtareWMt raam aaartmantt. 
ARulH only. C«l AM 4440*

pk} ma RRK TRIM HOMI an oarnarl 
4m, 1 k « m  Pan In n e a t coto Naw ' 
SnaaaNiR Caniw. ImmaR. p e ttn tion  Law 
aautty.

bill  s h e p p o r d  & c o
INDIAN HILLS . . Stagi la trtw «  tram 
IliH 3 karm, 3 ham. trick  HOMI Ranal 

covarto pafw a to  tita 
Truly a HOMR nt au«llv 

RrtcaR la Mil r « l  lar oppetnl.
L C r 1 RDRM HOME an I aert 
kurnlng firtlHoca m llv. rm , met rorpn.

1417 W ood AM 4 2991

FOR SAI.E BY OWNER

d a ta  In

1 btorenm. 7 tioth Wirk ham», <itn wlin 
flntHer». rommataly ra rp n m  rnfnonrotad

tUJOa TOTAL tar ««» Unmar ) Mrm 
kto. HOME HI Cenaa« Rork Spoclain 
llv. rm. witli ptefurt window otforai 
fcaautttui vtaw FHA loan ovoikibia.

I air. ftnraa raid. 
It at itarao*

all aiacfric kilctian

NICELY RURNISHRO 3 
man«, aanai ray ha«. ARuItt anty 
a « ra  40
QUIET, ATTRACTIVI 3 
turnitnaa agartm iri Rrlvota aalcany. 
arapat. « I Mill paM IV« iMIaa tautn 
HHpimiv 17. 144 manm AA '
4 »
GARAGE APARTMENT 3 raam« « I MHt 
paid. SIS waak. 3M Ektl Tto, agan 
i  ROOM I>l7rnTw EO opartmantt. prt 
v«a  DottM. friqtdMrat Riih paid Cleaa 
in. 40S Mom. AM «11*7

RANCH INN MOTEL

270.1 REBECCA 
AM 4 21«HOME WITH rMARM A WARMTH . ____ ____

" '',F O a  SAI E ar rant _  7 0 ^  Runnaft' 
IT ■*. T  . ? T  ^  I*»I3. 1 badrnom ITill. kllrhPartacl hld«o-m>y. In mit oftic rm tn r '„ ,  „ , 15. hvm« roam Uif77. AM 441*7

AvMlobla Aorll 111Raw 
«eytiouw 
ftraptoc*.

p leyrm , or puatt 7 «unito 
Dm oar., «ned. vd vrttti 

Raody cut togt lor tha kaouttui

SMALL RURN 
off Gallad . . .

HOME, on 7 loti, |u*l 
S 3J«  n .

VA. 4 . FHA. REPO'S
CALL HOME FOR A HOME

ASSUME LOAN, 1 kadroom« 1Vi kottit. 
Raropa. kullt lnt. naar Marcy Sctioal, pay 
manft HO AM 34(77

GREATLY REDUCED 
IN PRICE 

$15 00 Moves You In
1 badrenm« 7 batm. air, built In« S104MI, 
opproilmotdly MOM montniy.

320.500 BRICK HOME 
IN SAND SPRINGS

AM 44730

Ona A Tara Radroam Apartmant» 
Doily Waakly, Mantniy Ratal
4000 West Highway 80

RILLS PAID — Na«yty daceretad. 
homi nnd kitrlian. convamant la 
Wail H  AM 4 )1*7

tn*

JOE’S FURNISHED Apertman«». 
Wail Htpnwov H. c« l AM 4-M34

UNFURNISHED BOUSES
SAND kPRINQS — S rawto. bato, 
«ucea 7 badraana« laparata 
H acra «aneto yard, poto
trwN «raat Ctatoma MIÍKiiai 
Una. Ina«ra naat
SM7.

VAROS A QARORNS « ia to ,  ra to «
. RM* Yara a to  Owdwi 

RRana 1*143».

TELEVISIOIV StUEDELE

3 RROROOM. 14» RATHS, carp«, 
NIC butnin avan-ranga. «aneto

34)4» affw S.M p.m.
1 PEOROOM UNRURNISHRD,
Maar« weiher4rver cannactiana L<
I t o  Warran. Kay «  71R7 Warran. AM 
333»
n i  JOHNSON STRIRT — 7 kadraami 
a to  »m«l Ran, S7k martin. AM 3S4R
) RfOROOMS.
«aneto « ta cnaR 
bu<it-m ranga. (*S 
AM 34R17 ar AM 44tM.

IV» RATHt .  c a ry « , 

m an«^ 37H Cannatty.

SMALL HOUSR 
ana larga b 
AM « )» *

CaH

7 REOROOM UNRURNISHRD 
hr dacaratad, naar Junler Cditaga. S70 
manffi. Writa: Paula Mat«, Lompoao« 
Taiat.
NICR. CLEAN 7 badroam« aN canditlan- 
ad. oanm ray no«, carpar«, «aneto yard. 
IM7 Eot« l«n  AM 444U. AM MSM
CLEAN, TWO 
ciana tonrtd. ttarogt wwca. 
i n  Edit 3tm AM 37«».

ItimST.
7 REOROOM UNPURNISHID 
nauta, mnetd bockyord. 717 OdIlto. 
mofitn. aidtar furnHhtd. CaN Roy Tham- 
01. AM «7411
NEAR RASE — 7 
tancad yard, S4P 
coll AM «7344.

untumtahto.m
7 REDROOM UNFURNISHED «touaa. con­
trol naetmg, utility ream «yim trotnar 
ronntctlon«. L ec«td  «  7 |) Anno. OrilLARGE 4 ROOM, nterty tumfihad aport | aM 4 1M7

mmt, me# kHrtian and bom » 7  Scurry ' -------
7 REDROOMS. I »  WNRig.FURNISHED TWO badroemi, M) monm. 

«rotar poM. 4R» Rail AM 34173.
DUPLEX FURNISHED — 4 reami an« 
bom, «mll-«wll corp«, cempWaly ra- 
dacaratad. Milt paid. S7) menm. AM 
«3U1.
LARGE 3 ROOM dpertmard, caupla 
only, no pati. MH« pold. Avoiiokl« April 
lit. AM 4-P374
PURNISHED DUPLEX apartmant. 3 
ream, bom, carp«, larga ciatat», Hra

yard, S)S menm CkH AM 341».
UNFURNISHED THREE bodreem brick, 
cantral h a« . Mr eatoitlenad, aloctrlc 
bulIMn ovan-ronga. «roffiartoyar can- 
nactler«», carport, «anead yard. MO ■« 
gin, AM «3M7.

KMID

KNAPP SMOeS. c»m »«i t t o
“  company. X W. Wmd.

AM «47*7.

CNAMNIL I
MIDLAND

CARLI CHANNEL I

KWAB
CHANMRL «
RIQ fPfllNQ 

CARLI CNAMNIL R

KOSA
CHANNEL 7 

ODRSSA 
CARLI CHANNIL I

KCBD
CNAMNIL II 

LURROCK 
CARL! CNAMNIL 3

KVKM
CHANMRL « 
MONAHANS 

CARLI CNAMNIL S

4M
MONDAY IVBNING

POR CARINRT
{¿kin.'

«mrt and RimNurt r a

CARPET NEED CLEANING?
UPHOLSTERY SOILED? 

CaU
A-l JANITORIAL SERVICE 

AM 4-2364
Quallty-Servke-Lowext Prices

INCOME TAX SERVICE 
N̂ ÒMB tax -

E-6
Prom «, 
doy»; onytl 
AM 34447.

tarvtca. 
Aftw S:W «mak- 

traakato« i m  Ornant.

tax «rorkEXPRRIENCRO IN  COM  I  
Rena buaktaaplno larvka. 
r« » «  CaH AM 3M1R. I lf  Ulto Rood.
HATTERS me
HATS CLIANRO Oto kllcRad. AM «TRO. 
Coma out Old Son TLngata Highway la

HAUUNG-DEUVERING E-16
LOCAL OELIVIRY — Anytima, onythmg 
— S l.n  hour, 14.» leoa Inaurad. Prat 
aitlmataa. AM «7»0, AM 34M3.
CITY OILIVIRY —  RIM hour ar gOO 
truckload, inaurad. AM 34tlS. AM «27*«
PAINTING-PAPERING E-11
FOR PAINTINO, panar hanging on 
twionino cell D. M. MIRw, AM 4-S4*3.
PAINTING, TAPING. Tffitenlng No t o  
too imMI. Roaaonqkl« U. K  Moert. >W
Golvodon, AM 3-gSOk
PHOTOGRAPHEB8 E-13
FOR WEDDINGS ar Commarclol 
grophy c« l Cur lay Studio, AM 1071.

Caupl« oniy. IM Äait i*m. Apply am  340)3. 
1401 Scarry.

Par anly SI44IX) »34 »  do«m. S ig  manm 
3 bedreamt. 3 borni, dtn with flrtplec« 
larga living room, «rotar «voli, «rata ondi 
nict gordan e r ta  Will centidar trodt

DCNNIS THE MENACE
I 5 29

CALL 391 5277
3-BEURÜÜM

HOMES

NEWLY RENOVATED 
NO DOWN PAYMENT

Total Mo Pmt. $66.00 
liiliUry $63 00

•  U rg e  2 BDR.-$57 50 
$61 50

•  You Can Move In Soon . .  No 
Pmt. Due Til June 1st 
3 BDR All Comer Locxtion.s 
Select Your Own Paint 
Colors, Fir. Coverings, (^b
Tops
Yds To Be Top-soiled, Fer

tiltaed and Planted
•  Owned I t  Sold By FHA . 

Ifos. W arran t
•  A Few 2 BDR. Ready 

Move Into TODAY
OPEN HOUSE Every Day 

1304 GRAFA 
Paul Organ Real Estate 

i m m i t i  AM 36306
*f^ .6acM 0c o o h n Y M tu c f  OMNI«, n i ,
Ê u ttfâ tàu m t —

r iN « rH i

LOVtLY 3 REOROOM. 7 boHi, tomlly 
room, living room and don, bullten 
kltchan, ronga evm. dWnwdlher, dlipotol. 
corpatad mreughout. outstanding farKad.
Y«r<-. *1?* manm, no bHH gold. C«i r r r u u .T PICTURE tubai, I

ronty, popular typaa. tS t.g . IrtttaMad — 
S7* g .  W ailtm  t v ,  AM 344».

RADIU-TV SERVICES E-IS

4vy ROOMS. CLOSE In. Ca«)pla aniv 
Apply 4M Nolan o ff«  S;N p.m.
NICE, CLEAN 3 roan«» and 
«iroihar cannactlant. 
n § '^  Larltld. Coll AM «4441

ftnead yard. Saa at

hema, 7 kolh«REOROOM RRICK
fvan, rffrlgarolor >« ntadad. Can­

tral ha«-dlr, p«lo, ftnead, carport, I11S 
monm. 341S Colvin. AM 34340.
NICE THREE bodroom« lancdd yard, 
«vdihar connactlon« 1401 R htolrdj « M
7 badroom», goroga, 
rr  cennacllant. MI3 CordlnM. Rom In
Aylon Addition naxt to Rdia, S7S. C«l 
AM «74» or AM ««Og.
NICE, LARGE, 3 badroom. Wd«««- 
dryrr-tteva connoctlor«« contr« ha«, 
fancad. AM 4470). AM «4443.
) REDROOMS. NICE. RM monHl, 1411 

c« l AM «R377.
NICE THREE brdroom, 14RI Ma*0, 170 
monm, opan, AM «4377.
ONE, TWO, and m rat badroom« cldOn. 
datiroblt. phimlMd Iw 
Itncdd, AM «)4k4.
NICE, CLEAN 7 badreomi, 
yord, medtrn utllltia«, clota to 
shopping cantar. AM 344».

ichoeta.

FOR SALE OR RENT
2 and 3 Bedroom Homes 

No Down Payment 
Furnished or Unfurnished

C. V. RIORDAN & CO. 
2100 nth PI. AM 34601

F eBUSINESS BUILDINGS

RENT Or IrEASE
Briefc vanaw bulldint, opprax. Xhcl» It., 
) yrt. eld. «rill rtvomp tha Intar lor la 
luH ttnom. Plenty a t paved porklno, on 

n .  Contact C ^  McOanoM. Mc-

AM 4-71»  attar 6 CJI.«

•O xeR  TV o to  Rodio RtoOlr.
oppHonca rapok. CaN Roy ar 
«6*1, 1300 Hording.
CARPET CLEANING E-16

cleaning. Now agulpmant tor larvIcH 
carpal while «r«. Frao afflmott». A 
32*».
EXPERT CARPET Oto uphototory ctoon- 
Ing, toctery tra to d , raetonoDIt, tr ia  a» 
Itototta. AM «2744. A—I Jonitorlal Sarv- 
lea.
BIGELOW INSTITUTE
Kora p ro em  l _ , ___
Richard C  Thomo». Cali AM 
After ):30 p.m., AM 347f7.

Karp«- 
uptwlitary c lao n ^ .

EMPLOYMENT

5
6
7
8
9 ;

lOi
II

• TliB MekSi G U I Sacr« Storm Ntotch Come:1S The Match Game Sacr« Storm Sacr« Storm Match Gomo» Lata Mak# a  Oa« Pnce 1» Rlghl4S Lot» Make a  Da« Conor« Hotpll« Prko  1» RIght
: • IKomlc C«nl>« T Pamor Knowi Re«; l t Kamic C «m v« Tf«lma»ter Mavlatima Römer Kna«n Rest» iKamlc ComK« Traltmaitor Mavtotima Lañe Ronoer.4) IKamk Carni»« Treilmattor 7TCvwfV<»V*V Lañe Ronoer
W KM Shaw AOrnk« ragham ijlMar----*---

:1S ' WvWVWvaiW* KM Show Admk« Ragham --- - «-* --------«----
31 Rrinktov Rtaart MfbW mattar Crankita Rrinkiey Repíert:4S ISrlnklW Rwart News WoHar Crankita Srinkiey Reiwrt
W INavf» mm.--- Nato« Sports No«ri

:IS IW. Tax. Rtaart» Bruca Franar Waalhar Nc«rs
; » 1 Karan Ta T«l Tha TruHt Ta T«l Hm Truth Vovoge lo R «. «  Sea:4S 1 Koran Ta T«l The TruHi To TaN Rm Truth Voyoge te Ral. at Seo
:M Man tram Itocta I’va Oat A Sacr« I’va Oat A Sacr« Veyoge te t « .  at Sea:1S fwon vfvCfw I’va 0 «  A Sacr« I’ve G «  A Sacr« Veyqge te Rat. «  Sao
:» Mon from Uik Io Andy QrHtHh Andy Grimm No TWne lar Sgto.:4l i«4an tram Uncle Andy Griffim Andy Grifftm Na Time lar Sóto.
« IJ'thon WInlan (c) 1 Lava Lucy r Lava Lucy Janethen Wtotor»
1) IJ’lhon Wtotori |c1 1 Lava Lucy I Lava Lucy Janethon Winton

: » J'lhon Wtolart jc) Ring Croaby Many Happy Ralurna Janothan Winter»
.’4) iJ'lhon WInlir» (c) ■tog Croaby Many Happy Retump Jenomon WIniar»
;M AHrad Hfichcack Jimmy Doan Laramta Ren Caiey
;IS 'Alkad HHchcaek Jimmy Been Loramto Ren Caiev
:M 'Alfred HNchcack Jbnmy Doan Laramie Ren Co»ey
;4l lAltrad Hitchceck Jimmy Dean Loramto Ren Co»ev
; « INaof», Wiothaf Naato. Waalhar Ne«o« WeoltMr Nc«ys, Weather
:IS Iwad Tex Today Nevf« Woolhar Soerts News, Weather
: » ITamght Shew ic) Lota Shew Mavta Tenlght Show (c)
:4S ITonlghl Show (ct Lota Shew Mavla Tonight Show (c)
;» ITamghl Shew (c) Lola Shew TenlahI Show (c1
:l) ITenlght Show (c) Lota Show Tenlght Show le)
;M ITonlghl Show (c) Lola Show TonlgM Show |c>

iTenIght Show (c) L«e Shaw TontaM Show (c)

TroHmoitar
Trailmaatar
Trollmoitar
Tralimaatw
Sctancd Fictton 
Scianca PIctlan 
Scla««ca Fictlea 
Scianca Fictton
Science Fiction 
Scianca Rktlen 
Ntwt. Weethw 
Nawi, Waathar
Rlflamon
Rlttamon
Voyage to Sot. «  See 
Vovega to Bat. at Saa
Vayoga to B «. at Saa 
Vevoga to R«. «  Saa 
Na Tima tor Sargronti 
No TUna tor Sargaont i
Wendy and Ma 
Wandy o to  Ma 
Ring Creihv 
Rmg Creaky
Ran Coiav
Ran COMV 
Ran Cowv 
Ran Catty
Nawt. Wad mar, Spto.
Movía
Mavla
MOV la

W a lc li r iu ‘ B ( ‘ s l O n

T U ß D A Y  MORNING

HELP WANTED, Male F-1
up7 MEN, PART tima. Earn tS i and 

In »  hours par walk. Cor nKanory. 
Military oppllconti «vticoma. Can AM 3- 
4)4) tor Intarvlaw.
NEED 7 LICENSED Inauranci agenti to 
rapresant ralldbla Inturonca Company. 
HMPltWHotton, Income protactlen, Ufa 
and group Imuroncd. Soma laadi fur- 
nlihad. Write Rex Zh a r  c« l FEdarol 
74M4, OdasM.

a  :<X> 

6 » Sunrii# Semeoter
■

^  .45 Sunrite Semeeter
M  00 Today Form Fore J»»u»’ Lito R Tiochtoa Now», Wtomar
7  ■'* Todov Form Fore J«»u»’ Lito A Tiochtoo Farm Report

Today Ktoo and Odl# Educotlonol Today
;45 Today King and Odie EfhKotkmol Today

Ê4 Today Copt. Kangeroe Copt. Kangproo Today
0 : 1 } Today Copt. Kangaroo CajM. Kangaroo Todoy
O  30 Today Co«. Kangaroo Copt. Kongaroa Todoy
^  .4) Todoy Copt. Kangaroo Copt. Kangaroo Today

Trum Of C’a’» le) 
Trum or C’g'» (e) 
Wh f»  Thli Vg (C)

Donna Rood Morning N ra t KMdi« Kartoon ToIm  at Tex. Ronoert
Q : l ) Donna Road Morning N««rs KIddI« Kartoon Tolei of Tex. Ranger»
#  » 1 Love Lucy 1 Love Lucy Whot'i TMs Song (e) 

Whot's TKI» Song (ci
Jock La Lonna

:4$ WhT» Thl» S'n U) 1 Love Lucy 1 Lavo Lucy Jock Lo Lonna
«  db  

1 0 -

Concentr«lon Andy «  AAovkarry Andy or Mayberry Concentration Rlngo
Concent ration Andy «  Moyberry Andy «  Mayberry Concentration Blnqo
Jeopardy (c) Tlia Real McCoy» Tha Real McCeyi Jeopardy (c) P r k t  1* Right

^  :4$ Jeopordy (c) The Real McCoy» Tha Real McCoys Jeopardy (c) Prie# Is Right
■  w ;W :c« i Mv Riuff (c) Lay« «  Lito Love «  Lift Coll My Rluff (c) Donna Road

I I : »
C«l My RIuff (C) Want Adi Levo at Life Call My Rluff (c) Donna Road
I'll R« (c) Sdorch tor Tomorrow Starch tor Tomorrow I’ll Ret Ic) Father Knot»» Rett

■ :4I l’H R« (c) OuMIng Light Tha CuMIng Light I'll R « IC) Father Knows Re«

MECHANIC WANTED
Prttor with OM Exporlancd 

Ptonty at Work — Camm liato Rdtlt 
WHh Waakly Draw — PoM Vecotton 

Oaaortunlty tar Right Mon 
Saa Rrad Marbarry

McEWEN MOTOR CO. 
lOSScurry AM 44354

USE HERALD WANT ADS 

FOR BEST RESULTS . .

We’re Letttag Yea Kaow Where We Are—We Waat Year Basiaess! 1668 East 4tb.

TAKE-OUT FOOD-ANY HOUR •  FREE Mexican Dinner»
■ACH MORNING b 4 :»  toAM 4-7596 NOME OP D ie SPRING’S 

RINIST ROODS

KHRM*;4i
PANCAKE PATIO

T U B D A Y  A p rtR N O O N

12
1
2 «

btvorca Court 
CourtDiverea i 

Diverca Courl 
D hfor« Court

;00
: l );M
:4)

I Singa
Stogo
The Doctor» 

I Tha Doctors
00 .Analhar World 

iAnamor VtorM 
You 
YCb8 You Dan’t  Soy (cl
Iycm DeaT S r  (<)

PWwQR VVBUMIVv
Woman'» WorM 
A» Thd WorM Turn» 
A» T)w WorM Turn*

High Neon 
High Noon 
Ai the WkrM Turne 
A» the WorM Turn»

Ntw« Waoth« 
Community Ciaaaup 
L « ’» Moka A Oaal Ic) 
L«'» Moka A Deal (c)

Rebus Coma 
Rebus Goma 
Men Into Sooca 
Man Into Space

^OBBWOrd
Movseportv
HouiBiwrty

POMWOfd
Potaword
Heuseporty
Houseporty

Momanf at Truth 
Marnant at Trum 
Tha Doctor»
Tha Doctor»

Plom« In Wind 
Flama In Wind 
Day In Court 
Day In Court

FMma to Wind 
Rlam# to WMd 
Bdpo at N M

To Tell the Truth 
To T«l me TruHi 
i t e  at Ni»M 
i S k  ¥  NlfiQt

Anelhar world 
AnoHiar Wbrld 
You Don’t Soy Ic) 
Yku Don’t f t»  (c)

General Hoapital 
General lleepltcl 
Yeung Morrtodt 
Young Mkrrtodi

LUZiSi 
Mt Kd
CHIL

AyM
UUh
IRONIh 
C a n a ri, 
IRONIN 
AM 34

IROWIM

SEWI

ALTSRi 
AHcd RI

DRSSS«

We Hi

DOGS,
AKC RI 
Sdo afta) 
and Sum

411 Ml
CHIHUAI 
Dodtohur 
H (Mod
AKC RE
Ml Ydun
HOUSi
FI RESTO 
no totora 
1)01 Ort
GET PR)
ar tIJR 
L u a t^  I
HOLLVW 
kata . II!

FC
• 'RI

$ 2:
SI

403 B

g

Jfr



h 29, 1965

)ANS 
GUNS,
LES G 
ERS

IW I SlMp 
TWrd

n

M Wuwm<>. ;xi

LUMN
I .  RMm h r  tn t
car*, ni« Main.

llama, m  hm -

$44.00
54.00

ND UP

r AND 
DAYS
321

■7424

CVKM
CMANMIL « 
MOIMHANt 
LI CNANNIL 4

I Fiction 
I Fiction 
I Fiction 
I Fiction
I Fiction 
I Fiction 
Wootttor

I ta tô t. of Soo 
I ta *01. of Saa
I to lo t.  *f Soo 
I to *at. ot SCO 
no tar tarQMMitt 
n* far Sargaont*
and M* 
and M*:retby

MOV
Wooltiar, Saft.

If Tax. Kangart 
If Tox. Rongart .* Lann*.0 Lonn*

t  Rlgfit 
t  Right
Rood
Raad
Knowi Boat 
Knows Bast

I* Soae* 
lo Spoca
In Wind 
In WMd 

Court 
Court
Hotpital« «--«nvipfivi

Morrladt

WOMAN'S COLUMN J
CÎttMKTTŒ T i

CHILD c a r e "

Big Spring (T«xos) Herold, Mon., M ordi 29, 1965 7-B

J4
" » - o  CM« '»« Llore

Í*R *ÍÍÑ C ÍD  CHIIO owa-my 
BUI Cor latón Priva. 1-son.
BIUHM'S NURSIRY now a p ^  AM t  
bSm . NT Coti Uth. ^
H S ?  AnvtWn*. iQw4-7141 4w Waot Un.
L iC tN Sfp. OIFINOABLB and axa¿^ 
incod 0*1  coro. IIP. Wood. AM 4iS ;rXi5$L»Ä~ FIO

UUNDRY SKSVICE J 4
IROtllMO, -  «U » MIXBD datan. UlS

mONINC WANTtO-pklMp and dallvar.AM m u  ______________
4INO. tue DOZIN. Fica iMdaRvorari

IR0NIN0-4*-M OOIBN. m i  Mota Stroal.
SEWING J4
bMSSMAKINO -  MBS. Wlllla Spaok- 
arT S41S Moia. AM »711».

-  ALTCBATIOI«», AM 
44414. 4MS Boa» ifti. Mrt. Tippia.
M B I r o b b  oawfng, yaratlona. drop**. 
P r k «  rgoaanohl*. FtwM am  M tm, 
j t t t t  Ma4ry raaldanca. 4CÌ Staoliiav.
ALTIBATIONI MBN'S and woman's. 
arco BIbba am  S-aiS, m  Bwnnaia. 
U FHO^TIBY , OBABCBV, and sowli^

OBIStMAKIMO ANO AHaroflant. Boxi*

FARMER'S COLUMN
f a k h  eq u ipm en t K l
T iR U —Wl  Nova Mo Boat daol In ta«m 
an now or oasd. AH Sitas. MorcRaankt' 
Tira Stara. 7Ì4 Btaat Third__________
GRAIN. MAY. FEED I  S

HII9 MHMBE# IWW w W IQ W  lYWy.

FARM SERVICE K4
SALIB AMO Sarvka an Rada Aarmatai 
pumas pad Aormotar wtnMnllla. Utad 
K iinltla. Carrad 
tand Springt, ta a

Chaal* Wail Sarvka. »1-011
m e r c h a n d is e
RUnJHNG MATF.R1ALS L-1

PAY CASH, SAVE
•  SHEETROCK | |  O Q  

4x8x%. Per ihMt .
•  AD PLYWOOD 1 0  Q C

P tr  itoet
•  WIST COAST 

Sx4 A S slF I^
•  PICKET FENCE

£?......... ’10.95
•  SCREEN DOORS | C  A C

..................

7.45

•  HURRY •
JUST

3 DAYS LEFT
to tako advantago  of our 

SPECIAL OFFER

•  FREE •
'65 LICENSE PLATES WITH EACH NEW 

CAR SOLD BEFORE APRIL FIRST
TRADE NOW 

WE NEED USED CARS
HigheBt trade-bi aUtwaacM erer tflerod 

SEE ONE OF OUR 
FRIENDLY SALESMEN 

Rayfard GlUOua •  ckartea Haaa •  Dkfc FleMer

Big Spring 
Chrysler-Plymouth

M ILÍ-A -MINUTE MARTY SHASTA FORD SALES, INC.
TW Rtt«'« OLO X  V/W -U, 
A XRU RO O  —  \  T K U -
'C LA IM 9  MK H A « | H IM  T O  
A  DUAL P B R S O N y O O  C H A « C  
A U T V  VUM 9RUP

NO-HK'9 A \W 9 L L . 
0 0 N T 0 R T l0 N l9 'iy H R  S E A U -V  

^  ^_/vii(A N T O  
O lV K  H E R ,

H E  9H 04A D  B u y  HER. 
O N « 0 »  T H O S E  N IC E  

U 9 E O  C A R S  PR O M

SHAST A
Ford Solas

FALCON station wagon. V4, air conditioned,
standard tranamiasion. Eaay to claan E^l A Q  IS"
Vinyl interior. Come see this one ^  J

pickup. Custom cab, V4. automatic trans- 
mission, radio, boater, new Utm , wrap around 
bumper, bniah grille guard.
Like new ...................................... $1295

^ÊïiL CHEVROLET Impala 4-door sedan. Power steer- 
v - T  lag and brakes, air conditioned, V4. C O J L O C  

radio, beater. Chevroiet’s fiaest . .

A-1 SPECIAL
4 X C  MUSTANG. V-S 

engine, 4 -speed 
floor shift, full console. 
R a l l y  P a c  equipment. 
S.OM actual miles. This 
car is Just like new. Beau­
tiful deep C O O O i C  
blue finish

^ 6 1  HERCURY 4-door hardtop. Power seats, win- 
^  '  dows, steering snd brakes, air conditioned, auto­

matic transmission, radio, boater.
Road ready .......................................

^ 6 3  FORD 4-door Custom. Automatic transmlssloo, C- 
cylinder engine, low mileage. A lot C I O O C  
of good service left hi this one . . . .  ^

^ 6 3  country sedan. V-8, radio, heater, air con-
diUonad, power steering and brakes. luggsKe 
rack, automatic transmission.
Real sharp .........................................

600 E. 3rd AM 44214

SHASTA ALES«
MERCHANDISE
HOUSEHOLD GOODS L-4

•  FELT 
ILLb........ Per RoD
DOORS (KC) 
M (% R I» ss)

,’1.95 
«.’8.95

•  SHINGLES, Composition, 
n «  Lb., K
Per Sq...................  J

V EA ZEY  
Cash Lumber

SNYDER, TEXAS 
Lamesa Rwy. HI SJH12

S p e c i a l s
Interior A Exterior Paint 

$2 50 P tr  Gal.
USG Joint Cem ent............11.95
Alum. Storm D oors.........^ .0 6
9 F t  Picket Fence. R nll. .  910 06 
4 F t  Picket Fence. RoU . .  $1296
2.0x6K Mhgy d o w ............ $540
4 BdM. UsM T r im .........C ^ p
21x6.1 Screen d o o r .........96 »
3.0x3 0 Alum. Window . . .  $11.75 
2 0x2.4 Alum. Window . . . .  $9.90 
2 Bdla. Used Lumber . CHEAP 
Plastic Cement gsl........... $1.90
We Hsve A Complete Line Of 

Csctus Psints 
CALCO LUMBER CO.

406 W. 3rd AM 9-2773
DOGS, PETS. ETC. L4
AKC BECISTEREO ChlhuMiuo 
Sa* oftar S:00 p.m. ar all Ooy 
ono Sufidov, 14M Stadium, AM 4-1*04.
DACHSHUND FUFFY-mol*. All Mwtl. 
dawennod. AKC raglatarad, SU AM 
A714* oftar 7:»  pm _______

DOG BOOKS 
All Breeds 

Top Authors 
Illustrated

THE PET CORNER 
AT WRIGHT’S 

Downtown
419 Main AM 4-8277
CHIHUAHUAS, WIBIHAIBCD Ttrriar*. 
Poelwhimd eupplai . AKC ragittarad. M. 
M. tMoOl Wt*. AM 4d*91. ____
AKC BeOISTeBEO Boiaolt puppla*. M  
«1 Yawtg. AM 4477S______________
HOUSEHOLD GOODS L4
FIBESTONI 7 iBSS — 4 moniti* lo PO*, 
n^ lnforooi, HOlMng i_____ ___ ___  jimmt*
1»1 Ofogg.
OET FBOraSSlONAL corpat claoMog rF 
•ulta — rant Elactric Corpat Shompoo- 
*r t l .00 oar dOY wltti pwrdtat* af ShM 
Luatra. Big IpHng Hordwora.
HOLLYWOOD BCD-twIfi «Iza, naw mot- 
traa*. sis. Coll AM 4-77t 7 oftar 5:».

U pright M odel

FOOD FREEZER 
'REDUCED $30

$229.88
SEARS ROEBUCK 

& CO.
403 Runnels AM 4-5S23

MAYTAG Automatic Washer. 
Rebuilt, 6 moB. 'warranty $n.95
10 CU. FT. KELVINATOR re­
frigerator ........................ M0-9S
23 In. MUNTZ Console 
TV ...................................  159.96
Maple ZENITH 21 In. console 
TV 1 yr. warranty on picture 
tube.................................... $119.96
17 In. ZENITH Portable
TV .................................... IM.OO
38 In. GAS RANGE.........$4il6
Terms As Low As 98.06 Down 

And 16 00 Per Month.

BIG SPRING 
HARDWARE

115 Main AM 44266

USED BUGS 
FOR SALE

14 Volkswagen Sedae 
13 VeMswagen Sedan

VeMswagen *15ir Sedan 
*« VaMswngea Sedia 
13 VeMswagen Pkkap

Ceaplelely lecendMleeed 
111% GaanM eed

W«st«rn Cor Co.
Anthertad Saks *  Scrrlce 

3114 W. 3rd AM 4¥BR

500 W. 4th Big Spring, Texas AM 4 7424

HOW ARD  
JOHNSON  
Auto Sales
1411 W. 4th AM 3-1341

7 ^  Mapla Nvtng raam auffa ......... B».N
Naw Prandi Kill ar hot* t h t
•fin* aod fMd ........................ . W S OFF
bad! ...................................................
BENOiK OMiaoliHe wm0m  .........  m h
ypc. Badraam toda*................Wf.tS
Mmt Studi* Dfvan. tautrol aatara I*

MAVTAO Bawga. Ilka naw . . . ' . . ..........9**1
Aporlmant rongt* ............................  tW.N
Naw Baateoa* 0*0 aod draatar . .  wa.ts

.•!*áfS5M.M
*•*****•#*•*

V (7* as
dd *•* odOd H4.M

«¡ÍJ",
♦ d"d ^OMng Tm *. 4 choir«, butfat 
Bafrigtrafara o* taw a t .........

H O M E
Furniture

Vetuawftn W* Wihl Be I
564 W. 3rd AM 34711
Take Up Payment—̂ Pc. HEY 
WOOD -W A K ^IELD  bedroom
suite ........................  $9.63 mo
5-Pc. Mshogsny Drop Leaf table
snd chairs ......................  $79.95
WESTINGHOUSE automstlc
washer .......................... 369 95
GE Electric R ange.........$89.06
DANISH walnut desk . . . .  $0.96 

Several Excellent Buys In 
Recovered Chairs

S&H GREEN STAMPS

Good HouseLeejilî

AND APPLIANCES

907 Johnson AM 4-2832
TBADlNC FOST—Acrata from Sfai* 
Hetpnoi — Uiad lumitur* bought and 
mM. am 44^
BIG SPRING FURNITURE 
110 Main AM 4-2631

USED DINETTES ................. S14.VS up
Utad Living Boom SuWaa........ SIf.fS up
NEW MA'TTBBSUS ....................  S14.00

I-4 IMM0 NS HMp«-S*< In

1_ j  .  PIECE gray ragataattad badrw 
wn* wHh box tpringt and mottrat* Silf.fS

new ptoffarm raefcart. wairtad cotar*. 
Wbii* may loaf .............................  »•♦-»»

VISIT OUR BARGAIN 
BASEMENT

HOFFMAN 21” Console TV. 
Mahogany finish, good condì-
U on......................................$75.00
AMANA combination r s f r i ^  
tor snd freezer, good condition,
la n e  size ......................  $79.50
PHILCO refrigerator, 7 cu. ft
nice and clean ................ $47.50
HOFFMAN TV, 21-tnch, table 
model with matching base, 
good condition ................  $60.00

STANLEY 
HARDWARE CO.
“Your Friendly Hardware” 

203 Runnels AM 4-6221

LALGHIMi
M -V m .R

Mi hr 1W CMn«* TMtaMSSÜ^wesia

(Ë 3

•A » joufleei. of ûÿHJy

Buy •
'65 GMC 
PICKUP

as low as

Î1795
at

SHROYER 
MOTOR COMPANY 
OLDSMOBILE-GMC 

434 E. 3rd AM 4-4131

MIRCHANDISI
HOUSEHOLD GOODS L4

FOR SALE
••flM vVM*VW VOTVOTw «fWwPi
•Ml; Me* MdHtoIra and Blaclrlc Slav*. 
Mil SoHd vAlnuf 0dm* Tabta, Ml; 
CamplaN Sat 0*N Chikt wtih Carl. Mlj 
>1 IncB Cono*la TaMrftlan. MS.

AM 4-2908
FURNITURK WANTED L4

HOME FURNITURE
Fgy* HMiatt Fric** Far

M4 waat Ird AM *4f r
PIANOS L4
SFINET FIANO Cod AM AS
FIANO BABOAINS-Tobt up poymao*« 
an Spintt Flonaa bi SIg Ipiing orao. 4 
rape*, t* ctwaa* Irom — mopf*. charry. 
walnut ar mahogany. Writ* C /rF f Mon 
ogar—Dae Yauno Mualt Co.. Mil Waal 
County Baod. Odaatg, Tanot.

GILLIAM MUSIC CO
Uaad Hommand Chord O rfM  dddd* •  S»S
Utad BolFoln Organ ......................SIMO
HomanO tgfnaf Flonaa . . . . . . . . . . . .a  444
BaflnWitd _MoMa_ Uprighf 
Hommand Sginaf Organ ....

Btbdddd*

Hammond ft Everett Pianos 
607 Gregg AM SJ863

Galaxle lOO’ 
4Hloor. Full power

S?.......... $2100
4 A A  CHEVROLET Impels 

sport coupe, stick

S2588actual m ike
i A O  THUNDERBIRD.

J ; ..‘?ri':.$3188
OLDSMOBILE sU- 

V w  uoa wagon. Loaded.

liS'i“ $1388special . . . . . . . .
CHEVROLET B e l-  
Air 4 -door. Pretty 

white and gray ftnlsfa. V-8

$788tUBSITllSSjOfI #•••
S C O  PONTIAC Star Chkr.

i " ‘rr . .. $688
WE HAVE OLDER 

CARS W n X  CARRY 
THE PAPERS ON '

Wouldn't you really. . .  rather
have a BUICKÜ

'65 BUICKS ARE 
EASY TO OWN!

No Monoy Down
TAKE OVER PAYMENTS

’S3 CHEVROLET
pkkap ...........11119 nu.

’H  PLYMOUTH .  t H 66 nM.
’l l  CHEVROLET %-ten. cab 

and ehiM k . .  $S7.M
•S7 CHEVROLET 34oer 

hnrdtep ......... $39.11 m§.
Can

OENE ALLEN  
AM 4-3195 • O PnC E

'S.

SK YLA R K  2*door Sport Coupe
twe tane pnkrt, V-1 taper tarMne tranamlislee. ^  
pewer stecfiai and hrakea. Radia, white tires, air C  
cendltlened. backap UgMs, tinted glass, wtadskleM 40 
washers sad deal speed wipers, ceaveeknee greep.
All federal taxes and traaspertatlen charges. Wla- 
dew sticker price 93INJS 3350

LOW, LOW MONTHLY 
PAYMENTS 1̂ ®

AUTOMOBILES M
TRAILERS

SPURTING GOODS L4
MERCURY-JOHNSON

OUTBOABDS

DftC MARINE
AM l-4»7 W. Hwy. 40 AM SMM
Nifw ELECTBIC UW ¿or. mML *r wllh 
trdll« .̂ ISM. Co« J ^ t 144.
1464 14 FOOT FISEROLAS boot. tf*«r- 
ing wh*oi. oloctrte itortir, ceMnU. urtnd- 
diMM, cey«r. M N-F m thr, Irhhr. 
AM M6M.
WANTED TO BUT L-14
WANT TO buy good 

AM »4N0.
Mod «cubo diving

AUTOMOSILES M
BUY wroacod and Old Automo- 
and Trucia. Co« AM »»SI, LMd- 

«oy Pool.
MUTORCirCLES ¡T í
s i t  THÉ Now Horloy Dovtdton MdO 
)M Mll*o por gallon. No Down Foy- 
rnonf—414 monPi. Coc« TMxfen't Motor 
cycit B Skvclo ihop *M Wo*t »rd. 
AM » 230.
SCOOTERS ft BIKES M-3
BICYCLE TBOUBIE4T W# rtgalr“ ^« 
bfeyet*« whoro port* ond occotiorl«« 
nro avoltapi*. CMI Thixton Bicycio S 
MoMrcycIo Mope fOB WMt Sra, AM

AUTO AfX.’KSSORIES
USED TIBBS, - r  JP-W. -
Conoco Utttt Crtútt 
Jentt, 1)0l Orogg.

jlinml*

TRAILERS M-S

mxLmurnßmrmmm

New Mobile Homes 
- Priced To Go!
See T he Price T ags Inside 
The Coaches.

The Saving To The Buyer 
Is MUCH MORE Than The 
Down Paym ent.

SEE ’EM AT

BURNETT 
TRAILER SALES

1903 E. Ard Big Spring
AM a m

SALE •  SALE
M obile Homes 

Boats —  M otors

II Wido 1 Sodreem

’2 4 9 5
Travel Trailers

’6 4 9
WHOLESALE PRICES 

Mercury • Johnson 

Boats • Trailers

_ Btntol FufCho*'* Trod**

Fort*— I neurone* B*poln

D&C SALES
AM »4337 W. Hwy. 40 AM »3*01

MOVE YOUR MOBILE 
HOME ANYWHERE 
O.K. RENTALS. Inc.

AM »d»7 W. Hwy. 40 AM »dM
NEW LABOE Tond*m *l*ck trailer, 
brok**, rolimg tollgot*. eocrlflc* at 1650 

Ml b t tttn  to opprocMdo. AM 3-4*00
TRUCKS FOR SALE M-9
1*14 ÇHEVBOLET FIÒIUIF! 
oo*. tooiodl 1 horto Toni
groctleoilyX— —  AkaoFMIgB* • ÄnR

__ ^  ^  . low mit*-
1 horto Tandem Iroikr, 

1 *Mf Tandem «toct
»47*3 doy», AM »1706 right»

1*01 F-l FOBO TBUCK, ndw Min» 
e ve rbe w fi 1*50 J t i f  Stdtton W ^ e n .  
Cdlldnf o * n d ttl«n  w ith  «v e rd r lv o .
Acfcwiy.

« 7 ,

M c EW EN  M O T O R  C O
403 S. Scurry BUICK-CADILLAC

★  SERVICE ALWAYS ft
PI

CharUe Clantea Jimmy Hopper Frank M aberryM
f A A  PONTIAC Bonneville Vista. Power steering n  

and brakes, factory air conditioned, 16,000 y  
miles by a careful local owner. Still has a, 
new car warranty.
PONTIAC BonneviUe Vista. Power steering 

brakes, factory air conditioned. Red and 
white. Real sharp. ^

/ X Q  VOLKSWAGEN. Red finish, extra nice. Radio, W  
heater, come see this economy csr to tp- W 
predate it. V

i A O  CHEVROLET BelAlr staUon wagon. P ow er-W  
Glide, power steering and brakes, factory air W 
conditioned, new white tires, one owner, low y 
mileage. Ready to go. *

'61 CADILLAC 4-door DeVille. Factory a ir condi­
tioned, plus all the other extras that go with 
Cadillac. See and drive It to aptireclate.

; g ** a | P (
r  TNiKOPlf WHO ]¡Am U
I e o * i . S F d i —1—

PONTIACInc
APPRECIATI YOUR BUSWiSK

AN 4

ft SAVE TODAY ft

Everybody Drives A Used Car
BUICK LeSabre 4-door hardtop. Power steer- 
Ing and brakea. Fsetory rafrlg- 
eratlon. 11,000 actual miles . . . .

r x o  CADILLAC 2 door hardtop. Power windows 
snd 6 way power seat, factory refrigeration, 
U)cal one owner with low C O Q O C
mileage .......................................

BUICK Electra ‘225’ 4-door. Power windows, 
power seat, factory refrigera- C O A O K  
tioa. Local one-owner. Extra nice

NASH 4 door Sedan. Automatic 
transmisión, radio heater ..............  ^ l 4 f c j

BUICK Spedal V-6 station wagmi.d^l X Q r  
Automatic transmission ............

BUICK LeSabre 4Kloor sedan. Power steering, 
power brakes, factory refrigera- C Q Q K  
tlon. Real nice ................................

McEWEN MOTOR CO.
403 S. Scurry AM 4 4̂354

BUICK. CAOILL/.C DEALER

AUTOMOBILES M
AUTOS FOR SALE M-16

AUTO FOR SALE •16
m t  Fa l c o n , n e w  tir*», «ngbw r*-
c*ntly ràbuHI. AM 34BU. ISOM Scurry.
1*11 CHtVB0L r t ,  ~FOUB g**r, V-4, 3ÌI 
*ngM*, «Flit* «mil*, «FII tr*g*. 04 m*nth 
ly. AM 44116.___________
HAvi USS6  eon — «ym 
l*5.M ono og. T*rm«. 7M 
AM 44011.

‘62 CHEVY Wgg. Air, FO . .  IWfS
r  CHEVY 44lr., V4 , FO ........  S3*S
■56 BUICK 2-Or. Hdip.........................42*5
'5* MEbCUBY OvgrWtvo...................OH
■S7 iTUDEBAKEB   m
liwlonf FuygHlM — TBAOE OB LOW 
DOWN FAYMENT.

766 E. 3rd 
AM 4-6011

— 1*64 drwri powoF lieerNoo

KAR CITY 
After 5:90

OWNEB GOING 
Fri», Otf

HM FOBD OALAXIE, 4 «**r, rgW*.
SM^ BiBg r ' B r f c i y * » I r i i ;
M CayUr.

Ov«r**o*
tlMoC I

iMi—C rr.lw F bro»«4. AM »4641.
»rd.|l*56 FONTIAC, ONE *«rti*r 

Irtntmtntitn AM 47111 *n 
Aittr J.M w**bdov«.

AUTOMOBILES M
AUTOS FUR SALE M-16
FOB SALE l«H FlytiMulh hor«*g B«t- 
v*g*r*, rodi*. h*ol*o dir, wiro ctoon, 
todningii. AM 44*0 .

1*64 YhUNDEBBIBOT, black bMh IdM 
p*«»*r F**rtng and brok**, outsmollc 
»rain|ot«iÿ on, good thdg*. AM VOM

1*64 FOBO GALAXIE, V-6. gir o*h«- 
tioaing, rddt*. h*dt«r, vinyl *«gl*. «nt- 
t i  (jSm. Co« AM U SH____________

1*57 TBIUMFH TB4  n J  In 
»4147 •■ikwMi. gflir ftlD 
BM Lvwi Ortvou

MUST
My gononol cor —
4deor. ThH cor I* axtro ntco — Miv 
•gulgood Including toctory ttr  condllton 
mg ond pramlum whild Fdooidtl tir**.
iiTbl

After 6:00 Weekdays 
WeekEOdi -  AM M002

>

March ^ T̂RADIN' SALE '̂
LICENSE PLATES ON EACH 

r K C C  USED CAR SOLD THIS MONTH

’63 RAMBLER 4-door. Air conditioned. aut(»natic trans­
mission, bucket seats with center con-
sole. Clean car .........................................

'06 FALCON sutlon wagon. Automatic tn a s -  C Q Q C

’62 FORD Galaxie. ^ 0 0 ^
Six-cylinder, 2-door ......................................

’54 FORD 2-door hardtop.
New tires ......................................................

’61 VOLKSWAGEN C 1 A O  R
convertible .................................................

McDo n a ld  r a m b ler
1667 E. 3rd AM 4 4 «

V f.

/ . ' i



. r îV ! . ' \ -  V"-. r- -' » . ■ I—-;---- :rvT
Ì .......

SEERSUCKER
JUMPER-ALLS
Ideal for shoppiiig . . .

yard work . . .  and dozen

of other activities . . .
In blue, grey or ton

ond white stripe cotton

Seersucker . . . sizes 12

to 20 . . . 6.00

CHEZELL SAYS 
POP INTO .A  "POP-IN"

4

b u r exciting new . • /

silhouette combines 

the comfort of o muu muu 

and the charm of a 

French smock or>d comes ond goes 

os you will . . . 100% coton 

in gay stripe and polka dot 

combinations or block and 

white doizy print . . . petite,
V

snrKiil or rhedium . . . 13.00 eoch

Boost Requested
WASHI.NGTON (AP)-Dotnes- 

tic sugar industry leaders have 
recommended that Congress in­
crease fixed quotas tor both 
beet and cane sugar producers.

Today à  Tersday Opee 12:4S

GIENN FORO 
Gm iOiNE PAGE 

mctiA LAMsaunr
WMKial J  MOIM ^

8-B Big Sprir^ (Texos) Heraid, Mon., March 29, 1965

Howard, Original Ruby 
Defense Attorney, Dead

New Shewlag Open lS :ti

DOUBLE FEATURE

"Foce of Hie 
Screaming Werewolf"

PLUS

Curse of Hie 
Stone Hond"

DALLAS (AP>—Funeral serv­
ices for Jack Ruby’s original 
lawyer, Tom Howard, will he 
held at 2 p.m. Tuesday iu Dal,- 
las.

Howard, 48, died Saturday 
night M minutes after being ad­
mitted to a hospital with a mas­
sive coronary.

Howard had complained of a 
pain iu his upper back for sev­
eral days.

Services will be at the Dudley 
Hughes Chapel.

Iw is survived Iw his widow, 
his mother, Mrs. Margaret Hale 
Howard, a son and three daugh­
ters.

George Senator, Ruby’s room­
mate, took Howard to police 
headquarters to represent Ruby 
shortly after Lee Harvey Os­
wald was shot to death.

Howard appeared in court 
during the t in t  few days of 
Ruby’s murder trial, a t which
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Ruby was assessed the death
sentence.

"Tom and (Melvin) Belli dis­
agreed violently rcgvding bow 
Ruby should bo defended. He 
said be pulled out of the cum 
when he felt the trial proce­
dures would resutt fat a coovlc- 
tion." said Mrs. Howard.

Howard, with his white Stet­
son and cigar, was a fawiiitde 
flguie at police beedqoarters 
and the county courthouse.

Dlst. Judge Joe B. Brown, 
who presided at the Ruby mur­
der trial, jailed Howard for an 
hour and a half la 1148 when 
Howard and an assistant dis­
trict attorney tried to outsbout 
each other during a trial.

In 1850 Howard and then Dist 
Any. WiU Wilson exchanged a 
tew blows when the state asked 
for a continuance of robbery 
cases against a Howard client 
and Howard said the state did­
n’t have a case and didn’t have 
the courage to dismiss it.

In 1861 Howard and Fred 
Bran«’, then an assistant dis­
trict attorney, paid 150 flnes for 
exchanging b l o w s  in Judge 
Brown’s court.

In 1980 Howard received a six 
month suspended sentence and 
was fined 12.500 in federal court 
for failing to file Income tax 
returns for three years.

As a result of this conviction 
Howard was disbarred for ^  
months.

OM Isttsr to «oeh ■guare» to 
fosm four o rd ln a rj worda.
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Steelworker 
Demand Eyed
PITTSBURGH (AP) -  The 

basic steel Industry learns today 
exactly what the United SteeL 
workers Union wants in a new
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ANSWERS TO BRIDGE QUIZ
Q. 1—Aa South you bold: 

AK18S 7AKJ« OAQiS A R I
The bidding baa proceeded: 

South Wert Nerth East
1 ^  Pass 1 A Pass
t  NT Pass 3 ^  Pass
,T

What do you bid now?
A .— ThTM ipedM. This «nows 

for oU conUnfMicl««. If MrtiHr 
hae a n r*  earU apaUa m lt ha ailf lit 
prafar to play tha fama in that 
autt. If hia Ud was baaad aa a 
four card n H, ha (till hat tha 
option of raturalnc to  four haarts 
o r  thraa_ no trump.

Q. 3—As South you. bold: 
AT4 ^ 8 4  0  A1898S3 A A J 7

The bidding has proceeded: 
Wert North East Soath
1 1 NT Pass T

What do you bid?
* A,—Thraa no trump. Your hand 
contains nlna points which, with a 
six card suit, la ampla to carry on 
to  falna. Thara la nothlaf to bo 
galntd by Jumplnc In diamonds.

Q.' 3—As South, vulnerable» 
you hold:
AA18S <7AJ1883 O K J 7 I  A 3

The bidding has proceeded: 
Wert Nerth East .South 
Pass ‘ 1 A 3 9  7
. Wbat do you bid?

A,—T w o. haarts. Wbllai It ts 
tampUnc to  donblo and aaaet from 
tho anamy a  sultabla toll for what 
aaay bars baan aa intamporato 
act, nayarthslass such a atop should 
bo taksn with caution whan support 
for partnor’s  ault la hald. Vulnar- 
ablUty la this casa mlUtaUa araiaat 
aa aarly douhlt. Ctaanoss to t sama 
ara too brlfh t to accapt what m l i^  
ba an inadaouata poaalty. Wara 
eluba and spades Intarchanfad, wa 
would favor tba doubla.

Q. 4—As South, vtdnerable, 
you hold:
A 8848  <787S4 'OKJS A K J

The Uddbig baa proceeded;
North East Soath 

Doable 7 -
What do you Ud?
Av—Two haarts. Your iralttaa ara 

mild and should bo shown at anea. 
A pass la not racommaadad, for you 
may nnd It tneonvanlsnt to  oatsr 
tfeu aaoOoa em u  Jatsr loaaA

q . 'S - A s  South, vutaiarable, 
you hoU:
A 4 t7RQ3 O K 3 3 A Q J 18718

Tha bidding has proceeded:' 
East Soath Wert North 
l A  . Pass 3 4  Doable 
RodsaUo 7 

Wfart do you Ud now?
Av-^>na or both of tho nppansuts 

appaar to ba taklne Ubartlaa wltU 
tba tnrtb. Tbwo la UtUa doubt that 
your aldo baa a gama. Inasmuch as 
your partnar was strimg onongh to 
mako a tako^out doubla a t aoch a 
high lavaL Parhapa tha atmospharu 
would boat ba cleared by paaaiiig 
and permitting partner to raaeua 
bimaelf tram  tba radoubla. If ba 
bids haarts you arm talaa and. If 
not. you may contract for gaam la  
cUba.

Q. 8 - ^  South you hold; 
AA84 ^ 8 7 1 3  0 8 8 3  AS88  

The bkkBng has proceeded: 
North East South Wert
3 O Pagg 2 NT Pagg
3 O Pagg 7

Wbat do you Md now? 
A ^T brao  no tramp, b e a p t  far 

tha aca your band la worthleaa and 
no Induoantant should ba offarad 
partnar to  go paat tba nina trick 
lavaL

Q. 7 - ^  South, you have t-  
80 part score and hold; 
«A X 8 t8 3  0  AKJ18 A 83

The bidding has proceeded: 
South Wert North East
2 A Pass 2 NT 4 A
*

Whst do you bid now?
A —Pam, This strategy la elaai^ 

ly Indicated. Partnar may ba In a 
position to Inflict a aavera sting 
and ba should ba given tha oonrtaay 
of tho road. If ba does not cHboaa 
to double, ba la obliged to proeoad 
with tha bidding Inasmuch aa your 
original bid wua forclag to  gamo.

Q -S-A aSouttyouhoId: 
4A18883  9 7 3  O J 8 I 3  A K I  

The bidding has proceeded: 
North E art Soutt Wert
l A  Pass 1 4  Z 9
Pass Pass 7

Wbat do you bid nosr?
A.—Two apartm OppoWta a  part, 

nar who baa opanod tha bidding, 
you eaoaot afford to aoO out ao 
cbaaply and, tlm tUa la not atrletly 
apaaklng n rabtddabla aulU thw s 
laaorthwaa- -------

contract for its 450,000 members 
who work in the natloa’i  sted  
milb.

The onion's economic package 
—wages and fringe-benefit pro­
posals and what it calls total Job 
security — will be formally 
presented to four Industry rep­
resentatives.

The industry bargalnen, 
beaded by U S. Steel Corn. Vice 
President R. Conrad Cooper, 
huldled behind closed doors last 
week In top-level talks with 
their eight USW counterparts 
led by nesiden t David J . Mc­
Donald.

The negotiators face a May 1 
strike deadline.

Rights Victim 
Kin In Seclusion
DETROIT (AP) — The griev­

ing family of an assassinated 
dvil rights sympatblKT r>  
malned m seclusioo today as 
gestures of sympathy poured in 
from dignitaries and little peo­
ple.

Vice President Hubert H 
Humphrey visited on Sunday 
the home of the slain Viola 
Gregg U uzn, 39-year-old moth­
er of five who was felled on a 
dark Alabama highway last 
week«

EXPRESSES SYMPATHY
A spokesman for the family 

said Humphrey expressed con­
dolences on behalf of both him­
self and President and Mrs. 
Johnson to Anthony Llnzzo, 51, 
and the children.

Charles (Chock) O’Brien, a 
Team sten Union boshiets agent 
and friend of the family, told 
newsmen that Hnmphrey "then 
went over and hugg^  Ilttla Sal­
ly, who was crying.”

"She can’t understand why 
her mother was killed,” lald 
O’Brien.

Sally. 8. was one of three girls 
and two boys left motherless by 
the murder of Mrs. Liuzzo. Four 
members of the Ku Ktox Klan 
have been charged in federal 
court in connection with the 
slaying.

MONEY, FLOWERS
O’Brien said money and car 

loads of floral offerings have 
been pouring in from across the 
nation.

Humphrey, in Detroit to ac­

cept a pharmaceutical award, 
was the last of several digal- 
taries who paid their respects to 
the family Sunday. He w u  ac­
companied by former Gov. John 

now Democratic na­
tional committeeman for Mkhl- 
gM-

Gov. George Romney stopped 
at the house Saturday and com­
pared Mrs. Unzao to the French 
martyr, Joan of Arc. Both died 
for what they believed in, he 
said.

Requiem Mass has been

scheduled for Toeaday morning 
at Immaculate Haart of Mary 
Church, with burial to ba ta 
Holy Sepulchre Cemetery,
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