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la tty ’s Komer
By

Kitty Montgomery

Vacation time is over 
around here and we are 
somewhat relieved. It’s al­
ways unnerving to be short- 
handed and in the news­
paper business you are forc­
ed to jump two pages when 
that last minute ad comes in 
about deadline time. This 
throws everyone into a fren­
zy. You’ve either got to come 
up with enough late minute 
news to fill up or get out and 
sell enough extra ads to fill 
up. I guess you could just 
leave it blank, but I don’t 
believe I’ve ever seen it 
done.

Anyway, last week while 
one of our regulars was on 
vacation, we set up for six 
pages Monday. Monday af­
ternoon we jumped to eight 
and Tuesday about deadline 
time, we jumped to ten. 
Haste makes waste and be­
lieve me we heard about it 
the next day. When you 
don’t have time to proof 
read, you really get into a 
peck of trouble. We had 
more mistakes than the San 
Angelo daily.

A boring job, proof read­
ing, but I guess about the 
most necessary function in 
the process of putting out a 
newspaper. Sometimes the 
proof reader does get a few 
laughs, and no doubt would 
like to just let it go as is for 
the fun of it. While proof 
reading a report of a ladies 
club meeting late one night, I 
came across this. “ Members 
present were Mrs. John 

- Jones, Mrs. Tom Smith, etc, 
etc, and one beast (guest) 
Mrs. John Doe.’’ Another 
“The first county fail (fair) 
was a huge success.’’ Then 
there was the one about the 
Historical Society that start­
ed out like this “The Hy­
sterical Society appointed..’’ 
Sometimes the proof reader 
wonders if the type setter 
isn’t trying to put one over on 
him.

Then there are the head­
lines. This is the last thing 
you do before pasting up the 
paper and I can always sym­
pathize with the weary head­
line writer. Your words and 
characters must fit the space 
and they are supposed to tell 
the story as well. Sometimes 
this seems an almost imposs­
ible task, especially in writ­
ing heads for one-column 
stories. I know we’ve prob­
ably had some dandies, but I 
get most of my laughs from 
other papers. Somehow I fail 
to see the humor in our 
errors or ridiculous head­
lines. My favorite bad head­
line was in one of our dai­
lies. In big bold letters it 
read: “ St. John’s Head Re­
leased.’’ As it turned out it 
was a story about the head of 
a hospital being released 
from the hospital following a 
car accident. Mr. White’s 
favorite was a headline read­
ing “ Heart Rendering Story 
Told.’’ This one speaks for 
itself, doesn’t much matter 
what the story was about.

Then there’s the trouble 
you have with spelling. You 
can be a perfectly accurate 
speller, but as deadline time 
nears words tend to look 
wrong even if they are spell­
ed right. By the time the 
deadline gets past you can’t 
even spell kat.

kk
Just had a second-hand 

complaint from Trooper Joe 
Miles. He has informed me 
through Tom, that kids do 
not get drivers licenses at the 
tender age of 14, they must 
be 16 even with drivers’ ed. 1 
stand corrected. However, I 
know for a fact that there are 
many 14-year-old drivers in 
Ozona. I presume they are 
driving without licenses.

The second complaint was 
about a story we had in the 
June 30, edition giving the 
account of a wreck which 
involved a DPS car. I think 
it’s strange that Trooper 
Miles complained about this 
one. We took the story from a 
uniform report made out by 
Trooper Miles himself. 1 
believe the complaint was
(CONT’D ON LAST PAGE)

Annual Youth Rodeo 
Scheduled For August 5-6

mm..
OZONA HIGH SCHOOL BAND TWIRLERS recently 
returned from twlrilng camp In DaUas where they learned 
new rontines and participated In various shows and 
contests. These glris will lead the Lion Band in halftime 
shows and parades. In addition they wiU represent Ozona

District 4-H  
Styie Revne 
In Ozona

The District 6 4-H Style 
Revue will be held in Ozona, 
Monday, August 1, at the 
Civic Center. 4-Hers from 18 
counties in West Texas will 
be participating in the day’s 
event.

West Texas Utilities Com­
pany is sponsoring the rib­
bons and pictures for each 
contestant. Officials from 
West Texas Utilities Com­
pany assisting with the show 
are Pat Wester, Joel Wilson, 
Bill Tedder, and Curley 
Hays.

Crockett County 4-Hers 
who will participate are Alma 
Kay Ramos, Sherri Buckner, 
Cynthia Trujillo, Judy Mor­
an, Kathy Weant, and Me­
linda Hokit. Rebecca Ever­
ett, District 6 4-H Council 
chairman will be assisting 
with the awards program.

The public is cordially 
invited to attend the style 
show and awards presenta­
tion at 1:15 p.m., Monday, 
August 1.

Ozona All Stars 
Beat Pecos 6-1

The Ozona Little League 
All Stars got off to a good 
start Monday night by beat­
ing Pecos 6 to 1, in the first 
game of the play-offs in 
Crane. They were scheduled 
to play Crane Tuesday night 
at 8 p.m. and results were 
not known at press time. 
Crane beat Big Lake 38-0 in 
their first game. Winner of 
the Tuesday night game will 
advance to the play-offs in
San Angelo, July 22, at a site Allen Dews. All boys on the
yet to be determined.

In Monday night’s game 
Blake Simpson scored the 
win for the Ozona stars.

Kent Hokit led the hitting 
with a home run and a single. 
Robert Flores had a single 
and a double for Ozona while 
Simpson added the other hit. 
Hokit also led the scoring for 
Ozona with 2. Other Ozona 
stars adding scores were 
Blake Simpson, Robert Mas­
sey, Willip Payne and Robert 
Flores with 1 score each.

High School in UIL contests. Giris are, standing, Gigl 
McKinney, head twiiier and senior; and Debbie Wallace, 
sophomore. Sitting are freshmen twirlers, Jennifer Marley 
and Molly Womack.

Sewing 
Program 
To Begin

The first back to school 
sewing program will take 
place Thursday, July 28, at 
the Ozona Community Cent­
er at 7:30. The series of 
sewing programs will be 
offered for homemakers that 
want to begin getting their 
children’s clothes ready for 
school.

Homemakers will learn 
how to make children’s hand- 
me-downs look fashionable 
and fit good. New fashion 
trends, applying trims and 
decorative stitching will be 
discussed. Participants will 
bring their children’s gar­
ments and work on them in 
the last class.

Starting line-up Monday 
night saw Brad Elliott start­
ing at center, Blake Simpson, 
pitcher; Robert Flores, first 
base; Robert Massey, second 
base, Albert Borrego, short 
stop; Diego Leal, third base; 
Gino Tambunga, left field; 
Kent Hokit, center field; and 
Ronnie Galindo, right field.

Substitutes were Willie 
Payne, Ray Lara, Curt Mc­
Pherson, Henry Delgado and

team
game.

played during the

Screwworm Ozonans 
Numbers Fall Suffering 
Sharply

Lisa Mitchell To 
State Horse Show
Lisa Mitchell, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Mitchell, 
will be the only Ozona 4-H 
member among the top 4-H 
horsemen in Texas to be 
competing in the State 4-H 
Horse Show at the Astro 
Arena in Houston, July 
26-30.

Lisa will be one of some 
600 entries in the total show, 
with 280 of these being top 
qualifiers in each of the 14 
districts of the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service, 
the parent organization of 
4-H. Lisa qualified at the 
district show in Fort Stock- 
ton, winning second (dace at

halter and fourth in show­
manship. At state, besides 
competing in these two 
events, she will be entered in 
western pleasure and west­
ern riding.

The open invitational por­
tion of the show will be held 
July 27-28, with registration 
for these entries beginning at 
10 a.m. July 26. Registra­
tion for those entries that 
qualified in district competi­
tion will begin at 10 a.m. on 
July 28.

The first day of open 
classes will begin at 7 a.m. 
and will include preliminar­
ies in breakaway roping and 
judged roping along with 
competition in precision rid­
ing and cutting. The follow­
ing morning will feature pre­
liminaries in hunter hack, 
hunter horsemanship, work­
ing hunter and open jump­
ing. Drill team competition 
will also be featured along 
with preliminaries in show­
manship for those qualifying 
in district competition.

Finals in all the open 
invitational classes will be 
held Thursday, July 28, be­
ginning at 7:30 p.m.

The regular show for qual­
ifying 4-H’ers will get into 
full swing Friday with semi­
finals in showmanship begin­
ning at 7 a.m.

The sixth day of July, 
1977, was a big one in history 
of the 16-year-old Southwest 
Screwworm Eradication Pro­
gram, says U.S. Department 
of Agriculture (USDA) veter­
inarian M.E. (Cotton) Mea­
dows, Jr.

That day the number of 
confirmed screwworm cases 
in Texas livestock for this 
year (31) fell behind 1970 
levels. This makes 1977 the 
best year on record, says the 
program director.

“ Each day since has seen 
an improvement over the 
1970 situation,’’ comments 
Dr. Meadows. “ By July 15 
that year Texas had tallied 54 
cases. We still stand at 31 for 
this year.’’

Meadows credits the im­
pressive 1977 showing to 
many factors, all part of the 
“ Mission ’77: Stamp Out 
Screwworms’’ effort.

The “ S.O.S.’’ campaign 
features rancher care of ani­
mals and prompt submis­
sion of samples of all worms 
found in livestock wounds. 
Backing up the rancher effort 
is work by the Texas A&M 
Cooperative Extension Ser­
vice, the Texas Animal 
Health Commission, and dis­
tribution of sterile screw­
worm flies by the USD A 
program.

“ We were aided tremen­
dously by cool weather which 
suppressed the over-winter­
ing population in south Texas 
last winter,’’ says Meadows.

Also helping create this 
year’s pleasant situation is 
production of 200 million 
sterile screwworm flies in 
Mexico each week. Half of 
these flies are distributed in 
northern Mexico while the 
other half are distributed in 
the southwest U.S. along 
with the 200 million pro­
duced weekly at the Mission 
insectary.

From Heat
Ozona and Crockett Coun­

ty have been suffering along 
with the rest of the nation 
from the prolonged heat 
wave. Temperatures have 
hovered around the 100-de­
gree mark for the high for the 
day since July 1, with the low 
around 70.

So far in July there has 
been no rainfall recorded,  ̂
making it the driest month 
this far in the year.

Plans are under way for 
Ozona’s Annual Youth Rodeo 
to be held Friday and Sat­
urday, August 5 and 6. The 
rodeo is sponsored annually 
by the Ozona Lions Club and 
all local and area cowboys 
and cowgirls through age 19 
are invited to pick up entry 
blanks at the Chamber of 
Commerce and participate in 
the rodeo.

There will be the usual 
activities with the downtown 
parade kicking events off 
Friday afternoon. Shows will 
begin each night at 7:30. 
Lions Club members will be 
offering good charcoal ham­
burgers, hot dogs, drinks 
and all the trimmings at the 
concession stand which will 
open each night before the 
show gets under way.

Also scheduled for this 
year is a county fair which 
will be held in the park 
Saturday in conjunction with 
the rodeo. The fair will fea­
ture all kinds of fun and 
games, handcraft, art, food 
booths and many other it­
ems. The fair is sponsored by 
the Alpha Alpha Mu Soror­
ity. The sorority sponsored 
the first county fair last year 
as a bicentennial event. It 
was so successful they de­
cided to make it an annual 
affair and hold it during the 
rodeo this year.

The five queen contestants 
will be featured in the pa­
rade, lead by reigning queen 
Rebecca Everett. There will 
be several activities for the 
contestants during the week. 
Mrs. Mike Qayton is in 
charge of the queen contest. 
Selection and crowning of the 
new queen will take place 
during the show on the final 
night of the rodeo.

There will be three age 
divisions as in the past, 
contestants 12 and under, 13 
through 15 and 16 through 
19. There will also be 1 go- 
round for every contestant. 
Saturday night’s show will be 
made up of the top 6 con­
testants in each event from 
the first go-round with the 
exception of bull riders, 
there will be one ride only for 
bull riders.

In the 12 and under age 
group entry fee is $5 for each 
event. For girls there will be 
the barrel race, pole bending 
and flag race, and for boys in 
the same division, there will 
be pole bending, breakaway 
roping and flag race.

For the 13 to 15 age group, 
entry fee for each event will 
be $5 with the exception of 
bull riding and the entry fee

is $7. For girls in this 
division, there will be goat 
tying, barrel race, pole bend­
ing, and flag race. For boys 
there will be steer roping, 
bull riding, calf tie down, and 
hair pulling.

Entry fees are the same in 
the 16 through 19 age group. 
Girls in this division will have 
the same events to compete 
in as the 13-15 age group. 
Boys in this age group will 
have the same events as the 
13-15 age group except for 
hair pulling, they will have 
ribbon roping instead.

A trophy buckle will be 
presented to average win­
ners in all events. There will 
be ^trophies for second and 
third places. A trophy buck­
le will be the prize for best

all-around performance in 
each age group. To qualify 
for all-around, a contestant 
must place in at least 2 
events. All entries must be in 
not later than midnight, 
Monday, August 1. Entries 
should be mailed to Ozona 
Youth Rodeo, Box 1135, 
Ozona. Drawing for places 
and go-rounds will be held 
Tuesday evening. Married 
contestants are not eligible.

Entry fees must accom­
pany entry blanks and no 
en t^  will be accepted un­
less accompanied by a signed 
minor’s release which is on 
the bottom of the entry 
blank. Contestant numbers 
may be picked up at the 
chamber of commerce office 
between 1 and 5 p.m. Friday 
before the parade.

Discoveries And W ildcats 
Set For Crockett County

Second pay, the San 
Andres, was opened in the 
Harlaw (Grayburg oil) field 
of Crockett County with 
completion of C.F. Lawrence 
& Associates, Inc., Midland, 
No. 1 Harwood “A’’, V2 mile 
southwest of the discovery 
and 16 miles east of Iraan, 
for a daily pumping potential 
of 26 barrels of 29 gravity oil, 
no water.

Production was through 
perforations at 2,111-141 feet 
which had been acidized with
3.000 gallons and fractured 
with 18,000 gallons, and
18.000 pounds.

The following tops were 
picked on ground elevation of 
2,719 feet: Yates, 1,226 feet; 
Queen, 1,622 feet; and San 
Andres, 2,060 feet.

Drilled to 2,217 feet, 4Vi 
inch casing was set at that 
depth.

Location is 467 feet from 
the south and 1,980 feet from 
the east lines of 7-GG-H&OB 

The discovery, the firms 
No.l Harwood, was finaled 
March 9,1976 to pump 14 
barrels of 36 gravity oil, with 
gas-oil ratio of 120-1, 
through perforations at 
1,804-902 feet.

Brahaney Drilling Co., 
Midland, will drill a 7,500- 
foot gas wildcat in Crockett 
County, 6 Vi miles northeast 
of Iraan, IV* miles southwest 
of the depleted one-well 
KCA (Wolfcamp oil) field 
and three miles southwest of 
the depleted Que Suerte 
(Pennsylvanian oil) field, but 
seperated from both by a 
7,900-foot failure. It is the 
No.l Andrew P. Smith.

Location, is 660 feet from 
the south and west lines of 
3-G Schulz, Abst. 2840. 
Ground elevation is 2,698 
feet.

The KCA field, opened in 
June, 1958, produced at 
6,379 feet; and the Que 
Suerte field, opened in May, 
1965, produced at 8,390 feet.

Shell Oil Co. will drill the 
No. 1-105 Mitchell Unit as a 
5/8 mile north and the same 
distance southwest outpost 
to Ellenburger gas pro­
duction in the north portion 
of the JM multipay field, 34 
miles southwest of Ozona.

Location is 2,053 feet from 
the south and 1,867 feet from 
the west lines of 105-1-I&GN 
Contract depth is 14,250 feet; 
ground elevation, 1,818 feet.

The field has one upper 
Permian producer, which is 
in the ValVerde portion of 
the field.

Hospital
News

Patients admitted to the 
Crockett County Hospital 
July 12-19:

Lester Evans*
Helen Kenison*
Mary Dunlap*
James E. Smith*
Dina Williams*
Betty Jean Elledge*
Cruz Herrera*
Joe Gomez*
Lupe Rodriquez 
Geneva Harberger 

* denotes dismissal

OZONA LITTLE LEAGUE ALL STARS-Tlie team won a 6-1 
victory over Pecos. They played Qrane Tuesday night but 
results were not known at press time. From left to, right the 
boys are, bottom row, Diego Leal, Lonnie Galindo, Ray 
Lara, Brad Elliott, All^rt Borrego, Henry Ddlgado, Kent

Hokit and Curt McPherson. Top row, Gino Tambunga, Zeke 
Martinez, Alien Dews, Robert Massey, Willie Payne and 
Riaifpi Simpson. They are flanked by manager Jack Bailey 
and coach Terry McPherson.



PAGE TWO

THE OZONA STOCKMAN
Pablished eveiy Thors, at Ozona, Crockett Co., Texas

Subscription Rates:

$5.25 Per Year In Crockett County 
$7.50 Per Year Elsewhere

KITTY MONTGOMERY-Edltor & PobUsher

BEKIE DIAZ>Shop Foreman 
WILXA PERRY-Classlfied & Clrcolatlon

Published weekly since 1913 and entered as second class 
matter April 9, 1913, at the Post Office at Ozona, Texas, 
under the Act of Congress of March 3, 1879. Published each 
Thursday.

Notices of church entertainments where admission is 
charged, cards of thanks, resolutions of respect, and all, 
matters not news, will be charged for at regular advertising 
rates.

Any erroneous reflection upon the character of any person 
or firm appearing in these columns will be gladly and 
promptly corrected if called to the attention of the 
management.

CLASSIFIED RATES-12 cents per word. Mlnlmom charge 
$1.65 per insertion.

Q M E M B E R 1 9 7 7  ASSOCIATION

Third Centnry M editation

Remember when the Fourth of July was a big day? 
Americans used to be proud of their country and would 
sacrifice for it. We thought it was the best country in the 
world and we would defend it fiercely and with pride.

The situation has changed. The fate of the United States 
and its people is written large on one page of the WALL 
STREET JOURNAL, May 6, 1977.

1. During the month of April, wholesale prices advanced 
at a seasonably adjusted annual rate of 13.2 percent. These 
monthly increases in the cost of living will continue month 
after month, not at the same rate, but at a rate sufficient to 
double the cost of living every few years. If Mr. Carter gets 
two terms, it would be conservative to guess that before he 
leaves the White House, the value of the dollar will be 
around ten cents. This means it will have lost half of its 
present purchasing power.

The proper definition of inflation is “ an increase in the 
quantity of money.” As long as we keep issuing more 
money and credit, we cannot stop inflation. It will stop 
immediately when we stabilize the quantity of money. To do 
that, we must balance the budget and put an end to deficit 
spending. This will stop the increase of debt and stabilize 
prices.

Since the close of World War II, the quantity of money in 
our country has shot up from $36 billion to $322 billion. 
Meanwhile the national debt, wages, prices and interest 
charges have increase roughly in about the same proportion. 
If we do not stop deficit spending and the resulting increase 
in the quantity of money, this process will continue until the 
dollar is destroyed. This is what we call runaway inflation. 
We cannot escape it unless we stop increasing the quantity 
of money.

2. The budget for the fiscal year beginning next October 
has been fixed at $464.5 billion and the deficit for that year 
will be $66.4 billion. Actual figures for both budget and 
deficit usually run far over preliminary estimates. It is quite 
safe to assume, therefore, that these figures will be 
substantially more than those just noted. It seems 
altogether likely that our budget is now running more than 
$1.5 billion a week in the red. Yet Congress talks about 
appropriating money. We are not appropriating money. We 
are increasing our indebtedness. (During the month of 
April, the supply of money as measured by M-1 rose at an 
annual rate of 22.2 percent.)

3. During the month of March the quantity of consumer 
credit rose $2.72 billion. Interest on that increased amount 
of credit will amount to over half a billion dollars a year. It 
will be seen that in addition to increasing the federal, state 
and local indebtedness, we are also increasing the amount 
of private debt. This also adds to the quantity of money, 
increases interest charges, and makes it more difficult each 
succeeding year not only to pay the actual cost of living, but 
to try to keep up on the interest of previously incurred debt- 
plus something for reducing it. If we cannot live on our 
income this year, what leads us to believe we can do so next 
year, plus dragging along the dead horses-both interest and 
principle-of debt previously created?

4. A bill to strip the oil companies of the right to purchase 
foreign oil is in the House. This would be another long step 
toward control of the oil industry. It would mean less oil and 
higher prices-as government control or ownership always 
does.

5. Government ownership is sought in the name of taking 
natural wealth out of the hands of rich operators and 
corporations and bringing it back to the people. This is said 
to be for the purpose of letting all the people, instead of just 
a few wealthy ones, benefit from these natural resources.

Actually, government ownership does not bring anything 
back to the people, but in fact takes it farther away ft*om 
them. It brings the operation and control of our industries 
that are developing natural resources into the hands of the 
bureaucrats. Not to the people at all. What benefit do the 
people get from government operation of Amtrack, 
Tennessee Valley Authority, Penn Central Railroad, coal 
mines, steamships, or any other form of entrepreneurial 
activity?

The people have nothing to say about these operations, 
and nothing to say about how the profit, if any, will be 
divided. As a matter of fact, there won’t be any profit in 
government-owned businesses. There never has been, so 
what would lead one to believe there ever will be? The 
bureaucrats will find a way to absorb what otherwise might 
have been profit. Wages among government might have 
been profit. Wages among government workers at all levels 
are higher than for their counterparts in private industry. 
This is one reason why nationalization or further control of 
industry will never be profitable but will continue to operate 
at a loss.

How, and wherein, have the people profited from 
government ownership and operation of any industry? Do 
we want more Post Offices? The nationalization of industry 
results in waste on a gigantic scale.

Nevertheless, the slogan “ Let the people own their 
industries,” remains very popular-although in reality the 
public does not own nationalized property. It may be held in 
the name of the government, but it is not operated by the 
people, nor for the people. It is operated by and for the 
bureaucrats. They draw big salaries, more than their peers 
working in private industry and when the industries they 
operate no longer earn a profit, the deficits are made up by 
the taxpayer.

The people can control free, private ownership by voting 
for what they want, when they make their purchases, and 
getting it. They cannot so control government-owned and 
bureaucratic-operated properties, for they have nothing to 
say about what shall be produced, or how much. These 
all-important functions are discharged by the bureaucrats.

Brief Stories Of Long-Remembered Triumphs
A great m om ent in 

s p o r t s  o ccu rred  on 
March 6,1976 when Toni 
Innauer of Austria com­
pleted  the longes  
jump on record — 
feet 5 inches.
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A great m om ent in 
s p o r t s  o ccu rred  on 
Nov. 5, 1966 when Roger 
Taylor of Great Britain 
beat Wieslaw Gasiorek of 
Poland for the Kings Cup 
and set a tennis singles 
record o f 126 games. 
They played for 4 hours 
and 35 minutes.

~9 T . m
A great m om ent in 

sports occurred in the 
1976 Montreal Olympics 
when Rumanian Nadia 
Com aneci, 14, became 
the first gym nast to  
be awarded a perfect  
s c o r e  in O l y m p i c  
games. Up-and-coming 
American gymnasts can 
eat Butterfinger®  and 
Baby Ruth® snack bars 
to  raise their energy  
levels. -----
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Hifihliiihl'S
^  S ideliqh fs

It ■ I I -1 A o c IA r I o N

AUSTIN—Atty. Gen. John 
Hill and Gov. Dolph Briscoe 
have rival polls which con­
vince them they can win the 
1978 governor’s race.

Hill’s pollsters concede 
Briscoe is still out front, but 
they claim his advantage of 
incumbency is receding.

The attorney general’s 
problems, the Hill survey 
maintains, “is to penetrate 
the consciousness of the 
masses who don’t know him, 
to impress them favorably 
and to gain their support 
while maintaining the sup­
port of those who already 
prefer him over Briscoe.’’

The Hill poll concluded in 
one segment that 44 per 
cent of likely Democratic 
primary voters surveyed 
favored Briscoe, while 29 
per cent favored Hill, and 
27 per cent were undecided.

Pollsters for Hill also 
found a majority of voters 
are balky about re-electing 
a governor who would have 
served 10 years in office by 
the end of his next four- 
year term.

Briscoe’s campaign man­
ager said the governor has 
lost no basic strength and 
even has made gains since 
November, based on another 
private survey’s findings.

Both Briscoe and Hill 
have campaign headquar­
ters open here—although 
Hill has not formally an­
nounced.

Former Gov. Preston 
Smith is regarded as an­
other possible candidate for 
governor in the 1978 Demo­
cratic primary election.

Judges Busy
Texas Court of Criminal 

Appeals judges and com­
missioners wrote nearly 19 
times as many opinions as 
State Supreme Court jus­
tices last year, according to 
Texas Judicial Council sta­
tistics.

The top criminal court 
judges turned out 2,177 
opinions, compared with 115 
(and 667 dispositions of ap­
plications for writs of er­
ror) by the nine Supreme 
Court justices.

Fourteen courts of civil 
appeals wrote 1,562 opinions 
last year, while 329,373 
cases were disposed of in 
261 district, domestic rela­
tions and special juvenile 
courts—a two per cent in­
crease over 1975.

Another 286,415 cases 
were disposed of in county 
courts, and 918,000 traffic 
cases were filed in reporting 
justice of the peace courts 
—70 per cent of all cases for 
the j.p.’s.

The Court of Criminal 
Appeals must write an 
opinion in every case it de­
cides.

Economizing?
Twenty per cent of Texas 

visitors travelling by auto 
last spring stayed in homes 
of friends or relatives.

The percentage is five 
times above the in-home 
visiting level last year.

In spite of generosity of 
Texas hosts, the visitors did

lots of spending, however. 
The average group travel­
ling by car left $443.46 in 
the state, an increase of 
more than $40 above the 
spring of 1976.

The visitors stayed an 
average of 10.2 days this 
spring, 9.91 days in 1976.

Courts Speak
The State Supreme Court 

unanimously removed from 
office District Judge Garth 
C. Bates of Houston, who 
was convicted of accepting 
a bribe.

In other recent action, the 
high court;

Invalidated an antiquities 
code provision used to stop 
demolition of three down­
town Dallas buildings.

Took under consideration 
an appeal in an $800,000 
judgment against Bristol- 
Myers drug company favor­
ing a Corpus Christi man 
who lost his hearing after 
using an antibiotic for a hip 
injury.

Heard an argument that a 
Wichita Falls man should 
be compensated by Mexico 
for 218,000 acres of land 
confiscated from him in the 
Mexican state of Zacatecas.

A federal judge ordered 
a stay of execution for Wil­
bur Charles Collins sen­
tenced to die in the electric 
chair Sunday for killing a 
Waco convenience store op­
erator. The State Court of 
Criminal Appeals earlier 
had turned down the stay.

AG Opinions
In guidelines to the legis­

lature on school finance, 
Atty. Gen. John Hill noted 
that property taxes must be 
assessed on the basis of 
market value and that one 
kind of property cannot be 
assessed at a lower percent­
age of value than others.

Hill said he would have to 
see a specific bill on school 
tax values before he could 
decide its constitutionality.

In another recent opinion. 
Hill held Dallas school dis­
trict information on disci­
plinary action against stu­
dents involving corporal 
punishment is open to the 
public, as is certain other 
data on teachers, admini­
strators and student body 
composition.

Offices Filled
Sen. Peyton McKnight of 

Tyler was elected new pres­
ident pro tempore of the 
Texas Senate. He will take 
the oath of office after Sen. 
Don Adams of Jasper, the 
outgoing president, has 
served as governor for a 
day.

Tanner T. Hunt Jr., Beau­
mont attorney, is parlia­
mentarian of the Senate 
during the 65th legislature’s 
special session on school 
finance.

Short Snorts
An attorney general’s spe­

cial advisory committee has 
launched an investigation of 
nursing homes.

Insurance Board Chair­
man Joe Christie has de­
cided to remain in office.

Thursday, July 22, 1948
The Methodist Church will 

honor Miss Mary Riddle in a 
special service Sunday. She 
has been in charge of the 
Ozona Latin-American Com­
munity Center the past ten 
years.

29 yrs. ago
Scott Peters, vice-presi­

dent of the Ozona National 
Bank, has been named to the 
Boys Ranch Board.

29 yrs. ago
Mr. and Mrs. George 

Schulz, Jean Ann and Carol 
Lee, are in Chicago visiting 
his parents.

29 yrs. ago
M and M Production will 

drill an Ellenburger wildcat 
in the Noelke field.

29 yrs. ago
Robert Lee beat the Ozona 

Rebels 8 to 7 there Sunday. 
This was the second win of 
Robt. Lee over the Rebels, 
the only losses for Ozona’s 
team this season in league 
play.

29 yrs. ago
Mr. and Mrs. C.O. Walker 

and children have returned 
from a trip to the north­
west and west coast.

29 yrs. ago
Gift parties were held hon­

oring Daphne Meinecke and 
Myrtastine Hokit who are to 
be married August 5th.

29 yrs. ago
The first Democratic pri­

mary election to be held 
throughout the state will be 
held this Saturday. 70 can­
didates are on local ballot 
and will vie for voters’ favor.

29 yrs. ago
Charles Lacy Jr. is here 

visiting Mills Tandy, a cous­
in. He is from Abilene.

29 yrs. ago
Joyce West will leave Sat. 

for Boulder, Colo, where she 
will attend University of Col. 
during the summer session.

SNIPS QUIPS AND LIFTS 
> By Lottie Lee Baker

Someday we hope to be 
wise enough to get the vit­
amins that wild animals get 
by eating what we like. 

****
It’s true that women en­

dure pain better than men. 
Ask any shoe salesman.

****
My funds are at a low ebb, 

(void above line]

The way traffic is now, 
instead of getting a ticket for 
parking you should get a 
medal.

****
Middle-age is when you 

don’t have to have fun to 
enjoy yourself.

****
Some folks don’t look up 

until they’re flat on their 
back.

****
Air travel is wonderful; it 

lets you pass motorists at a 
safe distance.

****
Conscience is a small inner 

voice that doesn’t speak your 
language.

****
Children are the best pos­

sible aid to adult education. 
****

Some people are so inde­
cisive that their favorite color 
is plaid.

Now there’s a margarine 
for people over 40-the mid­
dle-aged spread.

The current status symbol 
is an unlisted zip code num­
ber.

**«*
A wife’s use of a joint bank 

account may cause a man to 
lose his balance.

****
You are an expert when no 

.one else knows how much 
more you have to learn. 

*«*«
Women don’t give away 

secrets; they just trade them. 
«««•

A lift For Hie Week
Worry is the advance in­

terest you pay on troubles 
that seldom come.

Q: My daughter’s been 
dating a boy for three years. 
Now she’s decided to marry 
him. Can my daughter get 
married without my permis­
sion?

A: A person who is 18 
years old or older does not 
need a parent’s consent to 
marry. If the person is 14-17 
years old, the parent’s con­
sent is required. In the 
event the parents are di­
vorced, the parent who was 
given custody of the child 
must give permission before 
the child may marry.

Q: My two grandchildren 
are living with my ex-hus­
band and his wife as the 
result of a divorce custody 
suit. The children cry to be 
with their mother, but the 
court says, “No”. Isn’t there 
anything that can be done to 
make these children happy?

A; The te s t the courts 
apply in awarding custody of 
a child is the child’s “best 
interests”. Even though the 
court earlier refused to 
award custody of your 
grandchildren to their mo­
ther, she could now ask the 
court to change the award 
and give her custody on the 
basis of “changed circum­
stances’’. This requires 
proving that continued cus­
tody of the children with 
your “ex” and his wife is in­
jurious to the children’s wel­
fare, and a change to the 
mother’s custody would be a 
positive improvement for 
them.

Q: Last weekend I was 
arrested for felony posses­
sion of marijuana. The 
search warrant stated that I 
was the owner of the house 
to be searched. That’s not 
true—it belongs to my par­
ents. Should the police have 
shown the warrant to my 
parents before searching the

place? In other words, was it 
an illegal search?

A: The constitutional pro­
tection against unlawful 
searches and seizures pro­
tects only against unreason­
able search and seizure. 
W hat’s an unreasonable 
search and seizure? It de­
pends on the circumstance. 
Generally, the Code of Crim­
inal Procedure says that a 
search w arran t must de­
scribe the place to be 
searched and the item to be 
seized. It is served on the 
person who has charge of 
the place to be searched, 
after being given notice of 
the purpose of the search. In 
your case, your lawyer may 
want to raise these ques­
tions at the proper time.

Q: We’re planning to sell 
our home. If we find a buyer 
who wants to assume our 
mortgage, instead of arrang­
ing for a new m ortgage, 
could our mortgage com­
pany come back to us for 
payment of the mortgage if 
the buyer can’t make the 
monthly payments?

A: Yes, any time you sell 
your home by having some­
one assume the balance of 
your m ortgage, the m ort­
gage company re ta ins the 
right to look to you for the 
monthly paym ents if the 
buyer fails to meet them. To 
protect yourself in a sale of 
this type, the contract bet­
ween you and the buyer 
should be written to include 
provisions allowing you to 
have title to the home re­
turned to you in the event 
the buyer defaults; then, 
you would resume responsi­
bility for paying off the 
mortgage.
Send your questions to “You and the 
Law,” State Bar of Texas, P. O. Box 
12487, Austin, 78711. Answers may 
appear in columns in hypothetical 
terms; persor -nswers not possible.

Jottings From Jan
By: Jan Naron

Standing on a footpad at 
10:56, Sunday, July 20, 1969, 
Neil Armstrong put his foot 
on the moon and said, “That 
is one small step for a man, 
one giant leap for mankind.”

It was eight years ago that 
the crew of Apollo II, (Neil 
Armstrong, Edwin E. Aldrin, 
Jr., and Michael Collins) 
made history as the first men 
to set foot on the moon.

John F. Kennedy prom­
ised men on the moon by 
1970, and despite our pre­
occupation with the war in 
Vietnam and the memory of 
the tragic Apollo I fire in 
which three astronauts died, 
we met the pledge. We not 
only met it, we beat it. Thus 
is the capacity of the 
American people and their 
government.

A year before projected, 
men landed on the moon, 
collected soil samples, and 
stationed two instruments to 
operate after their departure. 
Then, after eight days, they 
splashed into the Pacific 
Ocean, 950 miles southwest 
of Honolulu. They were 
home.

The words spoken by Neil 
Armstrong as he stepped 
onto the moon’s surface are 
meaningful, and permanent­
ly embedded into our history 
and our hearts-but when on 
September 16, the Apollo II 
crew addressed a joint sess­
ion of Congress, Edwin 
Aldrin spoke words of even 
greater profundity. He said, 
“ It is with a great sense of 
pride that I say to you what 
no men have been priviledged 
to say before: We walked on 
the moon. Those footprints 
belong to the American peo­

ple, and you...who accept... 
and support...the inevitable 
challenge of the moon. And 
since we came in peace for all 
mankind, those footprints 
belong to all the people of the 
world.”

Nice words.

P aiges Honor 
IVBss Banger; 
Mr. Bean

Miss Helen Bunger, bride- 
elect of David Bean, was 
honored with a brunch and 
houseplant party Wednes­
day, July 13, at the home of 
Mrs. Tony Allen. Other hos­
tesses were Mrs. Bill Black 
and Miss Sue Ellen Black.

Twenty-two guests were 
present.

Wednesday evening a pa­
tio party at the Eldorado 
ranch home of Mr. and Mrs. 
James Powell honored Miss 
Bunger and Mr. Bean. Ot­
her hostesses were Mr. and 
Mrs. Mort Mertz.

Ozonans attending were 
Shannon Dockery, James 
Hokit, Louis Bunger, Dan 
Bean, Rick Hunnicutt, 
Debbie Montya, Virginia 
Henderson, Hope Phillips, 
Wayne Bissett, John L. Hen­
derson, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Bean and Mr. and Mrs. 
George Bunger, Jr.

Carolyn Collyns of San 
Angelo was here over the 
weekend visiting her mother, 
Mrs. George Montgomery.

For greatest returns PF should be fed continuously 
year round. The resulting improved performance of 
your cattle will return you dollars for the few  
pennies invested in PF.

POSITIVE FEED (PF) is a lickable, likeable block of 
crystallized molasses incorporated with fats, minerals, 
vitamins and proteins and available in 50# edible cardboard 
boxes.

POSITIVE FEED assures accelerated rumen function to pro­
mote better utilization of available forage, year-round.

*  Higher Concentration of Nutrients 
*  Controlled Coitsumption

*  Improved Forage Utilization
*  Improved Animal Performance 

*  Labor Saving-Convenience

POSTZV£ FEED , INC.
Write or Call: BOB INGLISH,(713) 443-0222 

711 Rankin Road.- Houston, Texas 77073
Locally:

Ozona Wool and Mohair

Ozona
Business

And
Professional

Guide
‘THE FRAME SHOP’ 

Larry Hensley 
803 AveG 
392-2142

After 5:30 Week-day 
9-6 On Week-ends.

CAROL’S CERAMICS
901 Ave. J 
392-3482

Greenware-Duncan 
Paints-Supplies 

Will fire it for you.

MAXINE’S 
FLOWER SHOP

Fresh Cut-Pot Plants 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

STA-PUT CARPET CO.
1110 Ave. E 
Ph. 392-3139 

All Types of Carpet 
Dave Matney 

Owner

WINDMILL & PUMP 
SERVICE

A1 Thomerson 
Box 116 

Ph. 392-2577

VFW POST 6109
Regular Meetings 

Third Tuesday 
In Each Month 

8 p.m.

THE CATERERS 
Friday evening

& weekends 
Call

392-2335
392-3129

OZONA BUTANE CO.
Plumbing & Repair 

G.E. Appliance 
1108 Ave. E 392-3013

THE LINE
Your Party Merchant 

15 mi. E. off 110 
BEER, LIQUOR, WINE 

Ph. 387-2956

THE
BAGGETT AGENCY

Insurance 
“Your Protection 

is Our Profession” 
1114 Ave. E 392-2606

Beautiful Interiors 
Designed with 

DRAPERY - CARPET 
Fine Furniture 
& Accessories 

BROWN FURNITURE 
COMPANY

OZONA CHAPTER 287
Order of the Eastern Star 

Meeting Night 
4th Tuesday in mo. 

Masonic Hall

MEMORIALS 
OF DISTINCTION 
STONE ETERNAL 

MONUMENTS 
LAWRENCE JANES 

Call 392-3202

JOHN DOLL
Refrigeration

and
Air Conditioning 

Day or Night 
Phone 392-2512

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday Bible Study-9:45 
Morning Service-10:45 
Evening Service-6:00 
Wednesday-7:30 p.m.

CLIFF WILLIAMSON

Mechanic

1208Ave. F 
Ph. 392-2659

J.W. MOTOR PARTS

Auto Parts & Supplies 
606 n th  St. 

392-2343

B&C AUTOMOTIVE

Complete Auto Repair 
& Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 

Cor. of 11th & Ave. C
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We Are Tbe Beef People
ADIVISIfflIOFOTIHinai

,\  Prices Good Thurs. Ju ly 21 thru Sat. Ju ly  23LiOOO STAMPS!/
Right Reserved to Lim it Quantities No Sales to Dealers

Boneless Save SO' Lb.

Sirloin Tip
steak

Save 60' LbBoneless

Sirloin Tip
Roast

d
UJ^D i

USDA Choice Beef Thin Sliced

Breakfast Steaks
USDA Choice Beef Lean

Cubed Steak
Genuine

Chopped Sirloin
Wilson Certified or

Arm our Star Franks
Wilson Certified Rindless

Sliced Stab Bacon
Delicious

Whiting Fish

Lb

Lb.

Lb.

Lb

Lb

Oscar AAoyer Reg. or Beef

Variety Pak
Half or Whole, Smoked

Sliced Picnic
Smoked, No Centers Removed

Butt Half Ham

12-oz
Pkg.

Lb

Sliced

Bacon
Leo's Sliced

Meats
Hickory

Sweet
AH

All Center Slices

Sliced Beef Live r
W /D

Cooked Ham
Oscar Mayer Fresh Pork

Link Sausage

W/D Brand

Bolegna

Lb.

12-oz
Pkg.

$ | 7 8
$-|88
$ 13 8

$ 1 1 9

W
$149
7 8 ®$109

$229
$169

Jennie 0 Brandy

Tu rke y!
Roast

Save y o ' Lb.
LiniR One Please

9 9 ^
Cry-O-Vac

Hindquarter

3 9 < ^

Catfish

Steaks
Regular, 
Thick or

f U .  I  ,

rs Ppoduce

Fresh
W ater

V

A l Grinds Folgers

Coffee
Kbigsford

Charcoal

1 W
Can

I D - U .

$370
0 1 5 3

m ail.

BBQ Sauce
Z lŜ iz. S I  

B U S . I

W/D Handi-Pak

Ground
Beef Fresh 3 -Lb .

^  Pkii.

Stank Halt

Smoked
Ham No Centers 

Removed

Santa Rosa

Plums
Hunts
Tomato
Ketchup

32-OZ.
Bd.

Carnation

Slender
Vlasic Hamburger

DHIS

3 3 1 0 0
IO h k . I

6 9 < ^
32-ol

J a r

Frozen Foods

Crackin' Good

Saltines
s S T "

Showboat

Pork &  Beans

S lAVrOZ. ^  i
Cans I

T h rifty Maid Cut

Green Beans
IBVrOZ.

Cans

Sunkisf Valencia

Oranges 4  .*1®®
Sunkist Lemons or _  ^ _

Limes 1 0
Orange Juice Z -  88®
Fresh C a lifo rn ia

Celery . .  39®

Liste r ine 
Antiseptic 32-OZ.

s i s s j

Th rifty
Maid

Hour

Limit One Per 
Family W ith 

‘ 10. CX) or More

Sugar
Barrel

S U G A R

Sugar
5 9 * ^

5-Lb.
Bag

Buddies 
Hot Dog o r 
Hamburger

Buns
6-Ct.
Pkgs.

eChocolate
eLemon
eCoconut
eBanana
a S traw b e rry

Morton

Cream Pies
16 -oz.

Jeno's

aCheese
aHamburger
fSausage
aPepperoni

Pizzas
E t a .  8 9 ^

Kold Kountry Toter Rounds or

French Fries
Kold Kountry

Corn on the Cob
Kold Kountry Blockeyed Peas or Speckled

Butter Beans
Gold King

Hush Puppies

3
3
3

39®
$ 9 0 0

$ 9 0 0
$ 1 0 0

T lr ifty  M a U S a la il

Olives 13-oz.

S | 3 5 |

hist. Shave
Colgate 2 a ^ l |

^ ^ 5
Kp^^u-y Fresh

Syrup 320Z 0 9 ' '

W ildnson Stainless Steel

Blades 4 5 ^ .
f im .

A rro w
M ed. Grain
Rice
T h rifty  Maid
Tomato

■  5 3 '
Tomato A  $ 4
Soup lyioî oz.'̂  I

Th rifty  Maid Nled. o r Large

Peas
4 I 7 « . S 1

Cans ■

Root Bear
BUS. ■

H FC
Fru it
Drinks 2  46-oz. 1
A rro w

r S T  - a  3 7 '
Hersiiey
Chocolate E Q C
Syrup 16̂“  u 5 f

Dairy FoDds
Kountry Fresh 

Home Style or Buttermilk

 ̂ Biscuits
Cans

$ 1
Diamond

Margarine
Kountry fresh  Chunk Haifm oon

Lenghern Cheese .. . 9 9 ^
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Tips 
For Gardeners

From the
Ozona Garden Oab 

by
Mrs. Bailey Post

Though July and August 
are perhaps the most difficult 
months for successful 
gardening, we are fortunate 
to have plenty of good water 
available to keep our yards 
green and growing well. I 
notice several places are 
being asked to conserve 
water to avoid a shortage 
later on;if drought continues.

If the extended dry, hot 
days stay in the forecast, be 
sure to keep evergreens, 
both shallow and dry rooted 
varieties, well watered, as 
they need moisture the same 
as flowers and smaller plants

July and August are the 
months to plant Oriental 
poppies if you have a good 
open place or room for them. 
They will thrive in most any 
good garden soil with suffic­
ient drainage. Once estab­
lished in the garden, they 
need little but clean cultivat­
ion. No strong fertilizer is 
required, their favorite food 
being leaf mold. Since they 
are deep rooted, they rarely 
suffer from lack of moisture 
after the first year, or after 
they are well established. 
Clumps increase in size with 
age,and may be left in the 
same place for years.Mulch 
new plants under the leaves 
the first winter. The poppy 
season may be extended over 
period of nearly six weeks 
with different varieties. Seed 
pods should be removed as 
soon as the petals have 
fallen, and the entire top cut 
back as soon as it has turned 
brown. The pods are quite 
attractive and often used in 
dried arrangements. There 
are a number of varieties that 
will harmonize with other 
flowers and make a beauty 
spot in form of evergreens. If 
your poppies are crowded, 
clumps should be divided 
this month before planting. 
Look for new seed varieties 
in catalogs.

If you want face zinnias, 
now is the time to plant 
them. There are many new 
improved varieties in all 
heights and colors. Rotate 
the location of zinnias, which 
may prevent troubles and 
disease by not planting in the 
same place for two years. 
Soak to keep moist, rather 
than sprinkling.

Kitchen 
Shower For 
M iss Banger

A kitchen shower in the 
home of Mrs. Erby Chand­
ler Friday honored Miss 
Helen Bunger. Other hostes­
ses were Mrs. Glenn Burns, 
Miss Dawn Burns, Mrs. Jeff­
rey Sutton and Mrs. Johnny 
Jones.

Guests were Mrs. George 
Bunger, Mrs. George Bun­
ger, Jr., Mrs. George Bean, 
Mrs. Joe Bean, Mrs. Roy 
Henderson, Virginia Hender­
son, Darolyn Wilson, Debbie 
Montya, Marsha Kirklen, 
Lisa Clayton, Shannon Dock­
ery, Lynn Maness, Mrs. 
Weldon Nicks, Mrs. Hillery 
Phillips, Jr., Mrs. John 
Parks, Mrs. James Dockery, 
Mrs. Frank McMullan Jr., 
Mrs. Jim Bob Bailey and 
Carri Jane Chandler.

MARRIAGE ANNOUNCED-Mr. and Mrs. Rip Sewell and 
Mr. and Mrs. Winston Aldridge announce the marriage of 
their children, Kathy and Vaden, Thursday m o rn in g , July 
14, in a ceremony at the home of the bride. Both are 1977 
graduates of Ozona High School and will attend Sul Ross 
University in the fall where Vaden will play football for the 
Loboes.

Gift G )ffee 
Honors 
M rs. Heard

Before leaving for her new 
home in Fort Worth, Mrs. 
Pat Heard, the former Ann 
Glynn, was honored with a 
gift coffee, Saturday morn­
ing, July 16, from ten to 
eleven-thirty o’clock in the 
home of Mrs. Huey Ingram.

Greeting guests at the 
door was Mrs. Ingram, and 
receiving guests were Mrs. 
Heard and her mother, Mrs. 
George Glynn. Mrs. Dave 
Emler of San Angelo, aunt of 
the bride, was at the guest 
book.

The serving table was cen­
tered with a bouquet of 
spring flowers and guests 
were served mocha punch by 
Miss Becky Mathis, of Dal­
las.

On display along with the 
lovely wedding gifts were 
photographs of the Glynn- 
Heard wedding and recep­
tion of July 10, made by Mrs. 
P.L. Childress, III.

Other hostesses were: 
Mrs. Ted Lewis, Mrs. Bruce 
Mayfield, Mrs. Jerry McGin- 
gis, Mrs. R.J. Everett, Jr., 
Mrs. Hartley Johnigan, Mrs. 
Pleas Childress, Jr., Mrs. 
Weldon Maness, Mrs. Low­
ell Littleton, Mrs. Jack Da- 
vee, Mrs. Bobby Halydier, 
Mrs. P.L. Childress, III, 
Mrs. John Thompson, Mrs. 
Doyle Easterwood, Mrs. Ben 
Williams, Mrs. E.F. Sharp, 
Mrs. Thad Tabb, Mrs. Larry 
Arledge and Miss Lara Sue 
Arledge.

BOY TO TABBS
Mr’, and Mrs. Bob Tabb 

are the parents of a son bom 
July 8, in a Tyler hospital. 
The baby weighed 6 pounds 
and 15 ounces and has been 
named Scott Robert.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. J.R. Ellerd of Tyler and 
Mr. and Mrs. Thad Tabb.

COUNTRY CLUB BRIDGE
Mrs. Frank Tillman was 

hostess for bridge at the 
country club Thursday.

Mrs. Tillman won high, 
Mrs. Buster Deaton, second 
high; Mrs. Bruce Mayfield, 
low, and Mrs. Gene Wil­
liams, bingo.

Others playing were Mrs. 
Bob Bailey, Mrs. Cuatro 
Davidson, Mrs. Joe Friend, 
Mrs. Tommy Harris, Mrs. 
Bruce Mayfield, Mrs. Doug­
las Moore, Mrs. Kirby 
Moore, Mrs. Jake Short, 
Mrs. Sherman Taylor, Mrs. 
Evart White, Mrs. Gene 
Williams, Mrs. Jack Wil­
liams, Mrs. Jim Dudley, 
Mrs. Tommy Wilson, Mrs. 
Buster Deaton, Mrs. Hillery 
Phillips, Mrs. Dale Bebee, 
Mrs. George Bunger and 
Mrs. Qay Adams.

Recent guests in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Taylor Word 
were Mrs. Word’s brother 
and his wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Carson of San Marcos.

D & T SILVERSMITH
PRESENTS

TURQUOISE JEWELRY

Handmade 
Custom Made 

Children’s Jewelry 
Squash Blossoms 

Watchbands 
Rings

25% Off Retail Price

CROCKETT COUNTY 
MUSEUM MEMORIALS

Francis B. Montgomery 
in memory of Mr. Roy Hen­
derson, Mrs. Hugh Childress 
and Mrs. Lee Childress.

Oscar Kost in memory of 
Mrs. Mabel Wakefield.

The Joe Clayton Family in 
memory of Mrs. John R. 
Bailey.

Mrs. K.R. Stanton in 
memory of Mrs. John R. 
Bailey.

Mr. and Mrs. James Chil­
dress in memory of Mrs. 
John R. Bailey.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Faulk 
in memory of Sue Montgom­
ery Buck.

LONG FAMILY REUNION
Mr. and Mrs. L.D. Long 

were hosts for a family 
reunion for all their children 
and grandchildren over the 
weekend.

Attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. R.L. Nix and Chris of 
Yuma, Ariz., Mr. and Mrs. 
L.D. Long, Jr., Teresa and 
David of Austin; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Stewart, Loretta, 
Tim, Robert and Tina, and 
Jharon and Shauna House of 
Plano; Mr. and Mrs. Leslie 
Long and Heidi of Ozona.

Heidi and her grandfather 
are celebrating their first and 
sixty-fourth birthdays today, 
July 21.

Children learn right from 
wrong mostly at home- 
during three major periods, 
researchers say.

It is important that parents 
understand-and influence-- 
these “ stages” of their child­
ren’s moral development.

During the first stage, 
from birth to age eight, 
children cannot understand 
the needs of others. Their 
main concern is meeting, 
their own needs. However, 
children are completely dep­
endent on adults for guid­
ance--so this is the time to 
begin teaching obedience, 
because the child wants to 
please others.

Firm-but gentle-is the 
discipline is the first step in 
teaching obedience. Other 
ways include reading stories 
to young children about real 
people dealing with real 
moral decisions.

However, excessive am­
ounts of “ moral reasoning” 
in young children is usually 
wasted, as they are too 
young to understand this 
type of thinking.

In the second stage-- 
between ages eight and 12- 
children develop respect for 
rules. They express this in 
their play -listen to them say 
things like “ it’s not fair” or 
“But those are the rules” . 
This is a good time for 
parents to teach children to 
help out around the house, 
take responsibility, and learn 
to cooperate with others. 
Parents must continue to 
teach their children moral 
values and judgment during 
these years or the moral 
conscience will weaken.

During this stage children 
begin to establish values 
which will follow them thr­
oughout life-for example, 
who they will associate with, 
what kind of living they plan 
to make, how they will 
choose friends, and who they 
feel comfortable with. Such 
training also will help them 
weather the storm when 
adolescence occurs.

The third stage begins in 
adolescence and continues to 
adulthood. What may appear 
to be “orneriness” during 
these years is actually the 
adolescent’s striving for ind­
ependence. He is expanding 
his own moral awareness and 
questioning many of the 
injustices he sees in adult’s 
lives. The question “why?” 
becomes the key in his life.

901 Ave. J 392-3482

ANCHOR HOCKING

GLASS

WARE

GLASSES
SET OF 4 32 oz. glasses $1.79
SET OF 4 17^2 oz. glasses $1.59

SET OF 4 13 oz. glasses $1.39

ASH TRAYS
3 different sizes

75c to $1.00

MUGS
6 FOR 

6 FOR

8 oz.

9 oz.

$1.49
$1.98

We offer you a tremendous 
savings on Glass Wore 

while they Inst

WESTERMAN
DRUG

1000 Ave. Ph. 392-2608

Adolescents will only accept 
rules and authority if they 
believe that the principles 
behind them are sound.

Discipline for children 
should be in accordance with 
the child’s development. His 
parent’s expectations of him 
should be consistent with 
what the child is capable of 
understanding.
Sanuner Salad

Arrange 2 cans of drained 
orange and grapefruit 
sections in bowl. Circle with 
watermelon and cantaloupe 
balls. Garnish with sprigs of 
mint. Serve with Sour 
Cream Dressing.

Soar Cream Dressing
Vi cup plum, berry or currant 

jelly
1 cup commercial sour cream 
Beat the jelly; add the sour 
cream and continue beating 
until smooth. Makes l-y 2 

cups.

Bill (Sonny) Meinecke of 
Houston spent the weekend 
here visiting his sister and 
her family, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Dockery, and his bro­
ther, Bud Meinecke.

Quality home furnishings 
can be found at the Brown 
Famltnre Co. where service 
is a rule not an exception^

Fornm Has
CaUed
M eeting

Mrs. Kirby Moore was 
hostess for the Ozona 
Womans Forum called bus­
iness meeting Tuesday, July 
1 2 .

Proposed projects for 
the coming year were read by 
projects chairman, Mrs. L.D. 
Kirby. Members voted to acc­
ept the project report. Mrs. 
Gene Perry reported in year­
book judging, the Forum’s 
yearbook was rated only 4 
points below the state 
winner.

Several members volun­
teered to make tote bags and 
stock them for gifts for those 
attending the State Meeting 
of Federated Clubs which 
will be held in San Anopi^

Three new members 
were welcomed to the club 
membership, Mrs. C.O. 
Spencer, Mrs. Madye Jo 
Humphreys and Mrs. Huey 
Ingram.

Others in attendance in 
Mrs. Moore’s home were 
Mrs. George Bunger, Mrs. 
Dempster Jones, Mrs. Ralph 
Jones, Mrs. L.D. Kirby, 
Mrs. Jess J. Marley., Mrs. 
Gene Perry, Mrs. Arthur 
Phillips, Mrs. W.T. Stokes, 
Mrs. C.O. Walker, Mrs. 
Bonnie Warth and Mrs. 
Marshall Montgomery.

Luncheon 
Honors 
M iss Banger

Miss Helen Bunger was 
honored with a luncheon and 
rice bag party at the Civic 
Center Saturday. Hostesses 
were Mrs. James Dockery, 
Miss Shannon Dockery and 
Mrs. Dane Vickers of Lub­
bock.
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Guests included Hope 
Phillips, Pam Young, Gigi 
McKinney, Virginia Hender­
son, Darolyn Wilson, Marsha 
Kirklen, Lisa Clayton, Sue 
Ellen Black, Dawn Bums, 
Laurie Schneemann of Big 
Lake, Mri?. Weldon Nicks, 
Mrs. Marshall Montgomery, 
Mrs. George Bunger, Mrs. 
Joe Bean, Mrs. George Bun­
ger, Jr., Mrs. Mort Mertz of 
Eldorado, Mrs. George Bean 
and Mrs. Roy Henderson.

ANNOUNCING
Chonge in our Telephone Number 

Our number has been chonged 
from

392-2251 to 392-8750
Please make note of this change

FOODWAY STORE

All of as have memories that are worthy 
of cherishing. The same is trae of oar 
family names. They am worth cherishing 
and preserving. Yoor family memorial is 
one of the most important ways of doing 
this.
We have a complete selection of varioas 
styles and sizes.

last come by or call at yoor next 
convenience.
LAWRENCE JANES-Local Representative

Coleman Monument Works
DAVID HUFF-Owner

TRANQUILITY
Mrs. Baxter looks as if she doesn’t have a care in the world. She 

is always perfectly groomed. Her house and her garden, with its 
beautiful flowers, are always just so.

She isn’t trying to give a false impression; in fact, she would 
be horrified at the thought. But the truth is that things have not 
been all that easy for her. Her husband is a semi-invalid; their 
only son was killed in a tragic accident. She works in her 
husoand’s business three days a week, to help keep things go­
ing.

Where does she get her serenity ? How has she had ^ e  courage 
to accept so mudi adversity with so much grace? A friend asked 
her one day, and she pointed to the tall, white steeple at the end of 
the street.

Many people have found their answer in the Church. Haveyou 
looked there?
Scriptures selected by The American Bible Society 

Copyright 1977 Keister Advertising Service, Strasburg, Virginia

THIS SERIES OF ADS IS BEING PUBLISHED AND SPONSORED BY THE OZONA 
BUSINESS FIRMS IN THE INTEREST OF A STRONGER COMMUNITY.

Wednesday
Daniel
6 :1-18

Thursday
Daniel
6 :19-28
Friday
Jonah
1:1-17
Saturday
Jonah
2 : 1-10

Ranch Feed & Supply Co. 
Brown Furniture Co. 
Ozona Butane Co. 
Hi-Way Cafe 
Ozona Stockman 
Ozona Oil Company 
Ozona National Bank 
Ozona TV System

So. Tex. Lmbr. Co. 
White's Auto 
Food way Stores 
Stuart Motor Co.
L-B Motor Co., Inc. 
Sta-Put Carpet Co.
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SPECIALS e O O D - t h u r s . ,  t h r u  s a t .
CHECK THESE

SIPER MARKET.
U .S .D .A . FOOD STAMPS!

FIELD’S GRADE A Med.

RANCH BRANDRANKS
12 O Z .

LIMIT 3 W/SIO.OO 
PURCHASE. ANY 
ADDITIONAL PURCHASE 
48c DOZ. NO LIMIT

ARM ROAST LB.99t
RANCH BRAND 2#-4# BONELESS

HAMS LB . $1.69
BLADE CUT

CHUCK ROAST LB. 79t
LB. 89t

PEYTONS DEL NORTE BULK SLICED

BOLOGNA
7-BONE CENTER CUT

CHUCK ROAST 
CHUCK STEAK

LB. 89< 

LB. 99(

FROZEN FOODS
ORE IDA SHOESTRING 20 OZ.

POTATOES 2 FOR $1.00
p e t r it z  chocolate & coconut

CREAM PIES 2 FOR $1.00

VELVEETA
CHEESE

2 LB $1.98

ROUND STEAK
CENTER CUT

ROUND STEAK

LB. $1.49 
LB. $1.69

KRAFT CATALINA

DRESSING
KRAFT MACARONI & CHEESE

DINNERS

8 O Z . 49(

141/2 O Z . 69(

NESTEA 
$1.693 0 Z . 

JAR

25 LB. BAG $2.49
FOODKING

FLOUR
DEER NO. 1

TOMATOES 4 FOR $1.00
SHURFRESH TEXAS STYLE 12 OZ.

BISCUITS 3 FOR 89<

KOUNTY KIST WHOLE KERNEL

CORN 
4 "> $1.00

MAZOLA

CORN OIL OLEO 69t
KELLOGG CORN

FLAKES 18 O Z . 69(

Mountain Pass Tomato

SAUCE
8 0 Z .

6  '<’" $ 1 . 0 0
BETTY CROCKER

HAMBURGER HELPERS 694
HEINZ POLISH

DILLPICKLES QT. 89<
EDDRI

PAPER TOWELS 39<
EXTRA ABSORBENT

PAMPERS 24’ $2.49
BAMA STRAWBERRY

JAM 2 LB. $1.29

STARKIST

TUNA
6K2 O Z.

SHURFINE

COFFEE

Pidduce
Russet

Potatoes

PRESIDIO
Sweet & Juicy

Cantaloupes
LB. 194 

CARROTS
2 1 LB. 

CELLO 29t

LARGE

AVOCADOS
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High Fat Diet Is Healthy 
Livestock Producers Told
Livestock producers have 

been beleagured for years by 
claims that their meat and 
animal fat products were 
killing people, chiefly 
through high blood pressure 
and heart disease. Seldom is 
the other side heard.

One of the more recent 
blows came from the U.S. 
Senate’s “ Select Committee 
on Nutrition and Human 
Needs’’, whose report at­
tacking present meat con­
sumption levels later had to 
be removed from circulation 
pending revision. The report 
relies on statistics and gen­
eral correlations, but an in­
teresting personal account 
made 20 years ago arrived at 
just the opposite conclusion, 
and its proof was in the flesh, 
so to speak.
, The 1957 annual meeting 
of the National Livestock and 
Meat Board had as its fea­
tured speaker a colorful indi­
vidual who maintained that 
his self-chosen, abnormally 
high-fat diet actually improv­
ed his heart condition and 
helped him keep healthy and 
trim.

Described as an Arctic ex­
plorer, anthropologist, au­
thor and student of food 
habits, the speaker. Dr. Vilh- 
jalmur Stefanson, was then 
entering the third year of his 
latest run at a high-fat diet. 
He was a youthful 78 years of 
age.

“ Except for intervals of 
(dietary) orthodoxy, I have 
been among the heaviest of 
fat eaters all my life,’’ he told 
listeners.

Dr. Stefanson grew up as a 
cowboy in the Dakotas,

where he “ lived happily on a 
diet built around bacon, sow 
belly and hams’’. For most of 
the period 1906-1918 Stefan­
son lived with Eskimos with­
in the Arctic Circle. His diet 
there was made up entirely 
of meat and fish, and he 
recalled during that time 
feeling “ healthier than I ever 
felt and enjoying my meals 
more.’’

Ten years later, he and 
Arctic companion Karsten 
Anderson spent a year living 
in New York City on nothing 
but meat. The special diet 
was an experiment to give 
researchers a chance to study 
the effects of such a program 
under sedentary big-city con­
ditions. It was carried out 
under the auspices of Cornell 
Medical School.

The two adventurers fin­
ished the year in better 
health, said Stefanson, than 
when they began. The study 
was conducted at Bellevue 
Hospital, and Anderson, who 
had entered the program 
under treatment for high 
blood pressure, left the hos­
pital with normal blood pres­
sure, Stefanson said.

Stefanson’s 1955 diet pro­
gram grew out of a stroke the 
previous year and sufrering 
with rheumatism. He had 
been on a “ normal’’ diet 
since 1929, and elected to 
revert to his high-fat ways 
when calorie-counting failed 
to produce a doctor-ordered 
weight loss.

Two years later, speaking 
at the Meat Board meeting, 
he claimed he had accom­
plished not only the weight 
loss, but had rid himself of

PLAN TO ATTEND

The 58th Annual 
SHOW & S A L E -  

ROCKSPRiNGS, TEXAS
TEXAS AN G O R A GOAT RAISERS 

ASSOCIATION
JU LY  29TH-30TH 

S A LE -S A T U R D A Y , JU LY 30th
D O ES 10 :3 0 A M  BUCKS 1:30 PM 

125 Bucks—60 Does 
S H O W -F R ID A Y , JU LY 29th

LEM JO N ES , AUCTIONEER
Goats will be sifted & weighed insuring large, 

thrifty animals

joint soreness and stiffness. 
The blood clot that had 
caused his stroke was also 
gone.

“ What startles me now is 
how much more pronounced 
my health improvement 
seems in this latest high-fat 
pericxi of my life,’’ he added. 
Those attacking red meat 
and fats today suggest that 
daily intake of such foods be 
restricted to less than 10 
percent of total calories. 
Stefanson received 20 per­
cent of his calories from 
meat, the remaining 80 per­
cent from animal fat.

Physicians
Recommend
Vacations

The traditional summer 
vacation of the American 
family is highly recom­
mended by your doctor. The 
family needs to get away 
from customary home and of­
fice chores, forget day-to-day 
worries for a short time and 
generally get rejuvenated 
and ready to face another 
year.

Whether your vacation will 
be a short trip to a nearby 
lake, camping out in a na­
tional park, a plane trip 
abroad, or what have you, 
there are a few things to keep 
in mind that will help avoid 
having the holiday spoiled by 
illness.

Depending on where 
you’re going, you may need 
some vaccination shots. Te­
tanus, certainly for anyone 
who expects to include some 
out-of-doors activities. Ty­
phoid, if your journey in­
cludes areas where the water 
supply is uncertain. Ask your 
doctor about these, and pos­
sibly other immunizations.

The American Medical As­
sociation suggests that you 
remind yourself to use com­
mon sense about your va­
cation diet. Many a family 
trip has been spoiled by too 
many roadside hamburgers 
and soft drinks. A sound rule 
while driving crosscountry is 
to eat lightly. Be cautious 
about heavy, rich meals, 
particularly if you’re not ac­
customed to such fare at 
home.

Know what sort of climate 
you will encounter at your 
vacation spot and dress ac­
cordingly. It can get cold in 
the mountains at night, even 
in midsummer. Good walk­
ing shoes are important to 
the travel wardrobe.

Don't SPEND the summer h ere ...

S a v e
h e r e j ^  

now

With a gas grill on the patio, cooking heat stays outside so 
your house stays cool inside and you save on air conditioning. 
You save on cooking mess, too. Just set the controls, touch a 
match to the burner and enjoy tasty charcoal flavored foods. No 
mess. No bother.

Buy one of these grills 
before August 1,1977 and save $30!

MASTER CHEF AMK
(Charmgiow 2000) A popu­
lar-priced grill with 351 sq. in. 
of cooking surface. You set 
the heat you need with a turn 
of a knob . . . special H- 
shaped burner and perma­
nent briquettes heat entire 
cooking area evenly.

List price . . . 
NOW SAVE. . .  
Discount price. . 

5% sales tax . 
+ Cash price . . 

+ Budget price* .

$203.35
30.00

$173.35
8.67

$182.02
$219.96

Budget terms; no 
down payment, $6.11 per 

month for 36 months.

FLAVOR TWIN
(Arkla GRB-40) Unique dual 
burner, regulated by indi­
vidual heat controls, lets you 
heat either half of the grilling 
area separately from the 
other half . . . never uses 
more gas than you need, 455 
sq. in. cooking surface.

List price.......... $258.02
NOW SAVE. . . .  30.00

Discount price . . . $228.02 
5% sales tax . . . 11.40

4 Cash price . . $239.42 
+ Budget price* . . . $289.44

Budget terms; no 
down payment, $8.04 per 

month for 36 months.

PARTY HOST TWIN  
HEJ-1T
(Charmgiow 3200) Twin 
burners for different cooking 
temperatures on either side 
of grill . . . exclusive single­
dial control operates two 
burners independently or to­
gether for cooking versatility 
and economy. 461 sq. in. 
cooking surface.

List price. . . .  $259.89 
NOW SAVE . . . 30.00 

Discount price . . $229.89 
5% sales tax . . 11.49
-f Cash price. . $241.38 

+ Budget price*. . $291.96
Budget terms; no 

down payment, $8.11 per 
month for 36 months.

CHEF'S CHOICE CC-1
(Charmgiow 4000) Double 
cooking convenience . . . 
use one or both units . . . 
each has its separate con­
trols. A complete outdoor 
"range" with all the cooking 
surface you need — a total of 
702 sq. in.

List price . . . $369.89 
NOW SAVE . . 30.00

Discount price . . . $339.89 
5% sales tax . . 16.99
+ Cash price . . $356.88 

+ Budget price* . . $431.64
Budget terms; no 

down payment, $11.99 per 
month for 36 months.

+ Prices include normal post-type installation and 5% sales tax. *Budget terms are available at 12.75% annual interest on declining balance.

Call Pioneer or ask any Pioneer employee.

w n d
Mushrooms
Kill

Wild mushrooms continue 
to kill-last year, 21 Ameri­
cans, warns Mary K. Sweet­
en, foods and nutrition spec­
ialist with the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service, 
The Texas A&M University 
System.

These are the seven 
groups of mushroom poison­
ings: cyclopeptide, ibotemic 
acid, muscarine, hallucino­
genic indoles, gyromitrin, 
antabusic-like activity and 
gastro-intestinal.

Each type of poisoning 
produces a specific set of 
symptoms which follow the 
ingestion of certain types of 
mushrooms, the specialist 
says.

This warning: Do Not eat a 
wild mushroom from an un­

known source.
Also, Do Not rely , on the 

so-called “ silver spoon’’ test 
it proves nothing, the spec­
ialist cautions, and last year 
alone, it cost several lives.

This “ mushroom myth’’ 
holds that if a silver spoon is 
placed in contact with a 
harmful mushroom, the 
spoon will turn black. In 
reality, the spoon turns black 
because of the sulphur in the 
mushroom-not because of 
poison produced by the 
mushroom.
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RESIDENTIAL FENCINt
Chain Link Cedar Staves

Board Picket

Call: lim Baggett 392-2496

1 1/4 Oz.
Ben Gay

Ointment
Blistex 
2 For

6 0 s
Efferdent

Tablets

1/2 Oz.
Visine
Eye Drops

oxlra s(f«;nqtH„.‘ £  ]

efferdent
D ENTURE CLEANSER

2 1/2 Oz. 
Large

Brylcreem

Di-Gel
Antacid-Anti-Gas 
Liquid 12 Oz. or 

Tablets 100’s 
Mint or
Lemon Orange

$1”

lO N E E R  N A T U R A L  G A S  C O M P A N Y
(A Division of I ^ I O X K K H  c o r p o r a t i w  )

W e s t e r m a n  D r u g
1000 A ve . E i ' O zonajexas 392-2608
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Renee Hall of California is 
here visiting her grandpar­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Perry 
Hubbard and her great 
grandmother, Mrs. Cecil 
Hubbard.

Homeowners Need To 
O ieck For W hite Grabs

WESTERN MATTRESS 
COMPANY 

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 
Mattresses new or 

renovated
Box Springs-Cholce of 

Sizes and Firmness 
All Worit Guaranteed 

392-2031

The
Land
Bank

Long-term 
financing 

to help you 
reach your 

bng-term goals.

A . E. FRUGAL 
Mgr.

Ph.915 387-2777 
Box 397, Sonora, 

Tex. 76950

Now is the time for home- 
owners in Crockett County to 
check turfgrass areas in their 
home landscape for white 
grub infestations, according 
to Billy Reagor, County 
Agent. This soil insect is a 
very destructive pest of turf- 
grasses in homelawns, es­
pecially Bermudagrass and 
St. Augustine. This soil in­
sect attacks the roots of the 
grass plants and when their 
numbers become excessive 
in a lawn, feeding activity of 
the insects can result in 
severe damage to the turf­
grass.

The adults, known as May 
or June beetles, are about V2 
to 5/8 inch long and vary 
from light brown to black in 
coloration. The adults 
emerge from the soil in turf­
grass areas in late spring or 
early summer, mate and 
start laying eggs in June or 
early July in turfgrass areas. 
Eggs are laid in the soil and 
usually require about 2 to 3 
weeks to hatch. The egg- 
laying period averages about 
30 days. The larvae or grub 
worms are white with brown 
heads and the hind part of 
their bodies are smooth and 
shiny with dark body con­
tents showing through. They 
usually lie in a curled posi­
tion. The grubs feed on the 
roots and underground stems 
of grasses and other plants 
and in warm weather usually 
stay within one to three 
inches below the soil surface.

For effective control of 
white grubs in turfgrass ar­
eas, insecticide application 
must be applied to the infest­
ed areas when the white

f i l l
I

I 
I 
I 
I

FAMILY RECREATION CENTER 
NOW OPEN

Monday thru Thursdoy
6 p. m. to 12 p. m.

CLOSED FRIDAY
Saturday and Sunday

2 p. m. to 12 p. m.
P O O L - P I N B A L L - F O O Z  BALL 

AIR H O C K E Y -A IR  B A L L -P O N G
Come and bring the

entire family 
1112 Ave. E

rI
III

grubs are less than V2 inch in 
body length. In order to 
determine proper time to 
apply insecticide applica­
tions, it is essential that 
turfgrass areas are checked 
periodically in the month of 
July for white grub infesta­
tions.

To check for white grubs 
take a shovel and cut a one 
square foot section of sod 
and examine all the roots and 
soil to a depth of 4 inches for 
white grubs. After examina­
tion, soil and sod should be 
put back in place. Examine 
several spots in the turf­
grass area. White grubs 
normally are not distributed 
evenly in turfgrass areas 
because of a suspected ag­
gregation on the part of 
females at the time of egg- 
laying. Therefore, several 
samples should be taken in 
order to make certain that an 
infestation justifies trea t­
ment.

An insecticide treatment 
usually is justified when 
more than 4 grubs per square 
foot are found. Diazinon, 
dursban or dylox are the in­
secticides suggested for con­
trol of white grubs in turf­
grass areas in West Texas. 
Use of any other chlorina­
ted hydrocarbon compounds 
(heptachlor and chlordane) is 
discouraged since many grub 
populations have become to­
lerant to these insecticides.

Granular formulations of 
the above mentioned insec­
ticides are easier to apply 
and easier to wash into the 
soil than the liquid or spray 
formulation. When granules 
are used, follow the dosage 
rate listed on the insecti­
cide container label. After 
application of the granules, 
the treated turfgrass area 
should be dragged with a tow 
sack, water hose, etc., to 
knock the granules down 
near the soil surface. Then 
apply enough irrigation wa­
ter to wash the insecticide 
into the soil (V2 to 1 inch of 
irrigation water). When li­
quid formulations are used, 
follow the recommended dos­
age rate listed on the Label of 
the chemical container. 
Spray formulations should be 
applied at the rate of 10 to 25 
gallons of water per 1,000 
square feet to wash the in­
secticide into the soil. Wet­
ting the lawn before applica­
tion also helps. The key to 
control is getting the insec­
ticide through the grass to 
the root zone where it will be 
most effective. Keep chil­
dren, pets and other animals 
off the lawn until the insec-
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ticide has been thoroughly 
watered into the sod and 
turfgrass has dried. Always 
use insecticides with care.
Read the Label on the con­
tainer and follow the direc­
tions carefully.

Now is the time to check 
turfgrass areas for infesta­
tions of white grubs. Infest­
ed turfgrass areas should re­
ceive insecticidal applica­
tions prior to the 1st of 
August in West Texas in 
order to achieve an adequate 
degree of white grub control.
For additional information on 
•white grubs and their con­
trol, contact your local county 
Extension agent’s office.

The Scientists Tell Me.,. 
Learning About Snakes 
Can Save a Life
By Robert L. Haney 
T A E S  Science W riter

IVBss WOson 
Honored With 
Breakfast

Miss Darolynn Wilson, 
bride elect of Mr. Rick 
Webster, was honored with a 
breakfast shower Saturday, 
July 16, at the home of Mrs. 
,T.J. Bailey.

Tables were decorated 
with rice-filled tumblers with 
yellow ribbon stream ers. 
Place cards were a clock face 
depicting the hour of the 
wedding.

Other hostesses were Mrs. 
John Lee Henderson Jr., and 
Miss Virginia Henderson.

Guests included Hope 
Phillips, Pat Sanker, Sheri 
Webster, Karen Williams, 
Suzanne Williams, Debbie 
Montya, Kay McMullan, 
Mrs. Gregory Stuart, Jill 
Crawford, Mrs. Jeffrey 
Stuart, Mrs. Fleet Coates 
and Mindy, Mrs. Jim Sank­
er, Mrs. Dick Webster, Mrs. 
Chester Wilson, Mrs. Lowell 
Littleton, Mrs. Joe Bailey of 
Dallas and Linda Krzywicki 
of Lubbock.

Guests made rice bags and 
Mrs. Bailey presented Dar­
olynn with a three pence 
from England to wear in her 
shoe.

Vauglin 
Field Gets 
Location

M.C. Vinson, Midland, 
will drill the No. 3-18 Shan­
non, an 1,150-foot Queen oil 
test in the marginal six-well 
Queen oil area of the Vaughn 
multipay field of Crockett 
County, 12 miles northwest 
of Ozona.

Location is 990 from the 
south and 330 from the east 
lines of 18-UV-GC&SF.

ALL 1977 TRUCKS
CUSTOM DELUXE 3/4 TON 

4-SPEED
SCOTTSDALE 3/4 TON

- SILVER AD 01/2 TON
- CUSTOM DELUXE 1/2 TON

4-SPEED
1 - SILVERADO SUBURBAN 
3 - B O N A N ZA  1/2 TON

L-B MOTOR CO.
516-9th St.

More than 90 percent of 
snakes are non-poisonous 
and quite useful to man, 
according to a noted herp­
etologist at Texas A&M Uni­
versity.

“ And even the poisonous 
ones help keep down the 
population of rodents and 
other pests,’’ says Dr. James 
R. Dixon who is engaged in 
research on snakes for the 
Texas Agricultural Exper­
iment Station.

From years of study and 
research and a wealth of field 
experience, Dixon is able to 
relate dozens of useful 
findings. Since Texas is 
blessed with an abundance of 
snakes, he finds that know­
ledge of snakes can do much 
to relieve anxiety and pre­
vent indiscriminate killing of 
all snakes.

For example, two types of 
small snakes he often finds in 
flowerbeds around houses 
are quite harmless hunters of 
slugs and worms.

Other larger, harmless 
snakes may go in garages or 
other out-buildings after 
mice or rats. And if a house 
has any openings a snake 
may come inside for the 
same purpose.

Since there are so many 
different kinds of snakes
inTexas, Dixon says it’s 
easiest to learn to recognize 
the poisonous ones first.

He adds that in Texas 
there are four kinds of pois­
onous snakes: rattlesnake, 
moccasin, copperhead and 
coral snake. But, there are 
nine forms of rattlesnake in 
Texas, one of moccasin or 
“ cottonmouth’’, four types 
of copperhead, and one type 
of coral snake.
Trouble with the coral snake 
is that it can be confused 
with the king snake and the 
scarlet snake. All have bands 
of red, black and yellow or 
white.

Coral snakes though are 
the only ones that have 
yellow on each side of the red 
band.

A good handbook Dixon 
recommends is “ Conant’s 
Field Guide to Reptiles and 
Amphibians of North Amer­
ica’’. It’s available in in­
expensive paperback and 
pictures the different var­
ieties of snakes and points 
out identifying character­
istics.

Another good source of 
information is to check with 
your County Extension 
Agentfor MP-1194, “ Poison­
ous Snakes of Texas’’.

There are ever so many 
misconceptions about snakes 
Dixon says. In addition to the 
now well known ones about a 
milk snake can’t milk cows, a 
hoop snake can’t take tail in 
mouth and roll down hill, a 
“glass snake’’ (lizard) can’t 
break in pieced and then 
reassemble, other miscon­
ceptions are:

1. A rattlesnake always 
rattles before it strikes. Not 
so, if he’s asleep and you 
step on him or otherwise

startle him, he’ll strike and 
then rattle.

2. A poisonous snake 
strikes at a warm body 
because of a heat sensor. 
Actually, it’s a temperature 
sensor and snakes use it to 
detect a difference in temp­
erature. A snake may strike a 
cold-blooded reptile such as 
a frog, lizard or another 
snake.

3. A small poisonous 
snake is not dangerous. Def­
initely not so! Dixon says a 
small rattler is poisonous at 
birth and only the quantity of 
poison increases as it gets 
larger.

PAGE SEVEN
A coral snake is more to 

be feared than other Amer­
ican snakes because it has a 
cobra-like poison that works 
on the nerves.

Other American snakes do 
have a different type poison 
that works on the blood but 
the coral snake is not as 
deadly because of its small 
size and short fangs. It 
almost has to chew its poison 
in and its has little chance of 
doing this with a lethal dose.

Mr. and Mrs. Doc Lee of 
Hugo, Colo, were here visit­
ing last week.

The Frame Shop
CUSTOM FRAMING

NON-GLARE GLASS 
PROMPT SERVICE 

FREE ESTIMATES
After 5:30 p. m. weekdays 

9 a. ni. to 6 p. m. weekends
U R R Y  HENSLEY

H . 392-2142 M3 ®

BAILEY TIRE CO.
JULY SPECIAL

On Group 7 
Air & 0 0  Filters
while they last

Air Filters- $2.47 all sizes 
00  Filters - $1.50 all sizes

ALSO HANDLING AMERICAN RACING WHEELS.

WHOLESALE- Firestone 
Sonic
Brigestone
Toyo
Tarns

PHONE 392-3404 AT THE CORNER OF lOTH & F

O Z O N A JE X A S

After
SORRY
15 years of serving

Foodway , owned by Winn-Dixie
of Fla. \Ve can no longer
service their stores.

Field’ s Cage Eggs will be
available locally at!
lack’ s Super Market Trade Rite Gro. Cooke’s Market

Adobe Mini Mart Elina's Roadside Gro. Cisneros Gro.
Sonny’ s Drive In Ozona Quick Stop Ramirez Gro.

Only eggs produced in Texas can
carry the TAP and Produced
in Texas label.

Herbert Fields.
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Kitty’ s Korner
CONT’D FROM PAGE ONE

about the phrase ‘ ‘without 
stop lights or siren.” The 
report said the DPS unit was 
“ accelerating south without 
lights or siren when it at­
tempted to pass a vehicle.” 
When I read this, I checked 
with the DPS communica­
tions because I couldn’t be­
lieve a DPS unit was speed­
ing at night without lights. I 
was told it meant the lights 
on top of the vehicle, not 
headlights, as the report lead 
me to believe, so I wrote 
“without stop lights.” I 
don’t know what else you call 
those revolving red lights on 
top of the car. I still have the 
report if anyone cares to 
check it out.

kk
We’ve heard some flak 

about the proposed new 
signs being put up on I-10 by 
the chamber of commerce 
and the county. Some people 
think we might have thought 
of something more original 
than Ozona, Biggest Little 
Town in the World. They 
think it was copied from 
Reno, Nevada, whose motto 
is Biggest Little City in the 
World. However, since the 
letters and signs have al­
ready been ordered, we 
doubt there is much chance 
for change. I’ve been look­
ing at this sign in the park for 
so long, I thought probably 
Reno had copied us. Not so, 
the old-timers tell me. In fact 
there was quite a bit of flak 
when the motto was put on 
the sign some 30 or 40 or 
more years ago they say. Too 
bad we didn’t know about the 
proposal months ago and had 
a contest for a motto or a poll 
or something. But I guess we 
are too little, too late for this 
one.

Caulking 
Saves Money 
And Energy

“Caulk it,” and chalk it up 
to money saved, but before 
buying caulking compounds, 
locate air-leak areas.

Sealing cracks around 
doors and windows can re­
duce cool air losses from 15 
to 37 per cent, which saves 
money and cooling time, Ms. 
Moore says.

“ Caulking will cut down 
cold air losses and keep out 
dirt, dust, noise and mois­
ture. It is a tedious job, but 
most homeowners can do it 
themselves.”

Critical exterior areas of 
house, mobile home or apart­
ment that require sealing 
periodically are window 
frames and sashes, door 
frames, chimneys and joints 
between siding and window­
sills. Also between eaves and 
moldings, chimney flashings 
and the roof-as well as 
between vent pipes, water 
faucets, wire connections^

BIG ” 0 ”  
THEATRE

FRIDAY & SATURDAY

Sinbad a n d X llC
Eye of the 

Ti§er ^
Production SetvKcs by Devon/ P-B

© C o lu m b ia  Pictures Industries, Inc. 1977

SUNDAY & MONDAY 
TUESDAY

GRAND
THEFT

AUTO
W /Ron

Howard
WEDNESDAY-THURSDAY

jm m m

Find Safe 
Storage For 
Pesticides

The peak season for using 
pesticides is at hand, so 
home gardeners should give 
careful consideration to safe 
storage of these materials.

Pesticides are often stored 
in a garage or shed without 
thinking that this place is as 
dangerous as an unprotected 
medicine cabinet, says Billy 
Reagor, county agent with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

Curious youngsters often 
explore under kitchen sinks 
and low-to-the-floor places. 
These are the primary places 
to avoid for storing bleaches, 
pesticides and fertilizers.

High cabinets in the house 
or garage are suitable for 
storing pesticides if they can 
be locked. Often a symbol 
[skull and crossbones) that a 
:hild associates with “ bad 
s tu ff’ is helpful, reminds the 
agent.

Poison Control Center re­
ports reveal that children 
under five years of age are 
involved in more than half of 
all accidental swallowings 
involving a variety of sub­
stances. But less than five 
per cent of all these poison­
ings are caused by pesti­
cides.

Pesticides should not be 
kept in storage for more than 
a year to protect both chil­
dren and plants from the 
aged chemicals.

All containers used to 
store the pesticides should 
be non-breakable and closed 
securely.

Remember, pesticides are 
just as safe as the person 
using them.

E FOR SALE

FOR SALE-Appaloosa Mare- 
Phone 392-2261 or 392-3491.

16-tfc

FOR SALE-Young milk goat 
billies. “ Fender” Bassman 
amplifier, good condition and 
reasonably priced. Call 
392-2106. 20-ltp

[ AUTOMOBILES  
FOR SALE

FOR SALE-1975 Kawasaki 
F-7 175, Dirt and street bike. 
Call 392-3658.

20-ltp

FOR SALE
Wooden Clarinet. Call 

392-2283. 20-ltp

FOR SALE-1974 Black Toro- 
nado-Call Jim Bob Bailey at 
392-3404. 14-tfc

For Sale;1973 Honda SL70, 
1,700 miles $250 firm. Doyle 
Thomas, Box 111, or can be 
seen at hours #4, El Paso 
Natural Gas Midway Lane 
P l a n t .  2 0 - l t p

For Sale: 1969 3/4 ton 
International Harvester pick 
up with alaskan Camper, 
under 47,ooo miles, steel 
radial tires, two spares and 
CB radio. One owner car. 
Call 392-2689.

FOR SALE-2 bedroom mo­
bile home, nicely furnished. 
Located on Beall Street. Call 
392-2271. 20-ltp

For Sale-1976 Ford pickup, 
15,000 miles. Ph. 392-2164.

20-ltp

HAY FOR SALE-hygiera and 
hybrid sorghum. Call 392- 
3562 or 392-3007. 20-tfc

FOR SALE - 1973 GMC 
PICKUP* Sierra Grande, 
loaded. See at B&C AUTO 
MOTIVE.  19-2t c

FOR SALE-2 evaporative 
coolers and 1 Lennox fur­
nace. Call 392-3597. 20-ltp

[ HOMES FOR SALE

FOR SALE-16.0 cubic ft., 
frost-free Gibson refrigera­
tor, good condition. Ph. 392- 
2391 after 5 p.m. 20-ltp

FOR SALE-2-yr. old sorrel 
saddle broke horse. Call 
392-2541. 20-ltp

FOR SALE-Real nice dining 
room suite. Call 392-2238 or 
see at 302 Laredo St. 20-ltp

Sweatercoats for fall 
1977 wear deep armholes, 
large collars and long sleeves 
in angora, mohair, Shetland 
and other wool blends, says 
clothing specialist Marlene 
Odle-Kemp with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Serv­
ice, The Texas A&M Univ­
ersity System.

PHONE NEWS TO THE 
STOCKMAN.

OZONA LODGE NO. 747 
A.F. & A.M.

PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
OF GOD 

Santa Rosa St.
Sunday School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Sunday Evening 7:00
W ednesday Evening 7:00
Friday Youth Service 7:00

Everyone Welcome 
Services English and Spanish 

392-2164

HAYES 
Auto Repair
Mechanic On Duty 

8 a.m. - 6 p.m.

1311 Ave. AA 

Phone 392-3224___

V O l i
Drovide the  oroblem

CONCESSION 8:30 P.M. 

SHOW TIME-AT DUSK

we
supply the  solution

Have a yen for traveling this 
Summer? We’ll help you take 
the family on that super vaca­
tion! Our b u d g et-w atch er  
finance plan will get you pack­
ing faster than you think...with 
low-cost repayments that let 
you enjoy your vacation with­
out worries! Get the facts!

Ozona National Bank

FOR SALE-One house to be 
moved off of lot. Contact J.B. 
MiUer at 392-2641. 15-tfc HELP WANTED

FOR SALE-1973 El Camino. 
See Glenn Bums. 20-ltc

502 Ave. I, 3 bdrm house on 
large lot, 100x150. Shop on 
rear of lot. Call 949-9497 
in San Angelo or 392-2113.

13-tfc
FOR SALE-Spacious 3 bed­
room brick home, 2274 Sq. 
Ft. living space. Large Den-2 
car garage. 392-3494.

12-tfc

HELP WANTED-The Red
Apple needs someone for 
night work. Counter, cook 
and dishwasher. Apply in 
person at J.B. Miller and 
Company. 9-tfc

i JOHN R JONES
Real Estate Livestock

LOTS-HOUSES

BUSINESS.
SERVICES

AND

COMMERCIAL

[m iscellaneous

RENT RINSENVAC light­
weight steam carpet cleaner- 
made for heavyweight jobs. 
Perry Bros. 20-ltc

BUY AND SELL 392-2113

FOR SALE-3 br., 3 bath 
house, 1108 Sixth. 2,000 sq. 
feet, large yard. $32,000 
Call 387-3759, Sonora, after 5 
p.m. 41-tfc

Too many unwanted 
pounds? Trim them away. 
Diet right with Slenderite. 
Village Drag. 18-6tp

Develop your ideas for
your home with expert help 
from the folks at BROWN 
FURNITURE CO. Your 
dreams become realities with 
just a little help.

Golden Opportunity
Beautiful Spanish Oaks 

Ranch in the Abilene vicin­
ity needs mature couple to 
cook and maintain lodge and 
grounds. Housing and food 
provided plus handsome sal­
ary. Please mail informal 
resume and/or questions to: 

P.O. Box 2757 
Abilene, Texas

PARTIES are fun if your 
cakes or other goodies come 
from MITY NICE BAKERY. 
Please order early. 211 Mes­
quite. Ph. 392-3129. 17-tfc

SUPER stuff, sure nuff! 
That’s Blue Lustre for clean­
ing rugs and upholstery. 
Rent electric shampooer. 
Perry Bros. 20-ltc

WE BUY Aluminum Cans 
and Coors Bottles. GLENN 
SUTTON, 1103 Ave. H.

49-tfc

FOR SALE-Nice Home, 3 
bdr., IV2 baths, fireplace, 
shag carpet, panelled walls, 
partially furnished, fenced 
back yard. 392-3634 after 
6:30, or 392-3243.

LOST-male silver-grey toy 
poodle. Lost from 1108 Beall 
Sunday. Reward. Call 
392-3423 or 392-2056.

20-ltp

Desks, chairs, files, safes, 
large selection. Save 20%- 
50%. Cash and Carry. 9:00- 
5:30, Monday-Friday. 
VALUE CITY, 117 W. Two- 
hig. San Angelo, Texas.

15-tfc

JA Y  MILLER
CONSTRUCTION CO.

GENERAL DIRT CONTRACTOR 
OIL FIELD CONTRACTING

ROADS, LOCATIONS, PITS 

DOZERS, DUMPTRUCKS, MAINTAINERS

BRUSH CONTROL 
FAST, EFFICIENT SERVICE

AIRPLANE SERVICE AVAILABLE

392-3243 Pkone 392-2489

I GARAGE SALES J
GARAGE SALE-Fri. July 22, 
clothes, watch, tire, boat 
motor. 9-6, Corner ave. F & 
Second. Misc. items. 20-ltp

Clean carpets give a heal­
thier, more pleasant atmos­
phere. Have your carpets 
been cleaned the “ Steam- 
liner” method in the last 
year? Let us do the hard 
work. Call 392-2654. Mont­
gomery Ward, Ozona, Texas.

38-tfc

Reg. meeting on 
1st Mon. of mo.

NOTICE OF

REWARD

I am offering

$500 Reward
for {^prehension imd convic­
tion of guilty parties to ever>- 
theft of livestock in Crockett 
County - except that no 
officer of Crockett County 
may claim the rewind.

Billy M ills
Sheriff, Crockett Co.

LARGE MOVING SALE-sofa 
and chair; 5 pc. dining set, 3 
carpets with pads; fan, heat­
er, sheets, kitchen items, 
etc. Thursday and Friday. 
404-D Ave. G. 20-ltp

Monuments & Markers-
Contact ORVAL MANEY. 
392-2168. 9-tfc

♦

H & C BUTANE
Ozona & Sheffield I

392-3225 ■ 836-2745 I
Jerry Hayes - Dick Collett f

[ PLUMBING i
GARAGE SALE- Saturday, 
July 23, plants, 105 Live- 
oak Dr. (Chandler Addition).

20-ltc

INDEPENDENT PLUMBING 
& REPAIR-No connection 
with any local firm. ED 
CADE-Ph. 392-2786.

6-tfc

TOM MONTGOMERY
REPRESENTATIVE

Life Heidth
AMERICAN NATIONAL INSURANCE COMPANY
P. O. BOX 370 
OZONA, TEXAS 76943
BUS. 915/392-2551 l l f l i
RES: 915/392-3208

Ozona, Texas

Deaton Spraying
TREES-YARDS-SHRUBS

OZONA-392-2506

PETE W. JACOBY 
Real Estate

Residential-Business-Commercial 
Ranch Properties

Ph. 392-3059 401 Hillcrest

Thorp’s LaunDry

COMPLETE LAUNDRY SERVICE 
LINEN SUPPLY

SHOP TOWEL SERVICE

UNIFORM RENTAL 
ODORLESS DRY CLEANING 

PICK UP AND DELIVERY
DIAL 392-2484 OZONA, TEXAS

Nationally Aclvertised Ĝood Housekeeping <.
PHOWStS

M o r n i n g  O l o r y

Back Relief* Mattresses
famous for Quality since 1903

Brown Furniture Co.

Ozona Wtiterwell Service
Dennis Clark 

392-3056
SUBMERGIBLE PUMP DISTRIBUTOR 

PUMP AND WINDMILL 

REPAIR AND SERVICE

APARTMENTS 
FOR RENT
Nice Rooms

a FURNISHEDKitchenettes
.  -  FURNISHED1- Bedroom
* _  _ FURNISHED2- Bedroom
3- Bedroom

AU UtiUties Paid 
Phone 392-3437 

[Mrs. Kenneth Kramer]

CROCKETT HEIGHTS


