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City favors 'alley boxes' 

WESTERN ARTIST KENNETH WYATT 
. . . To speak at CofC banquet Saturday night 

CofC will stage 
banquet Saturday 

about 
dimmitt 
and 
castro 
county 
by b. m. n. 

A pecan tree will be planted 
on the courthouse square Sat-
urday as part of the Bicenten-
nial celebration in Dimmitt. 
Trees have played a prominent 
part in our country's history. 
Naturally, their most important 
usage by our forefathers was 
for the construction of log 
cabins for protection against 
the severe New England winter 
weather. Since that time lum-
ber from trees has been used 
for more purposes, possibly, 
than any other material, one of 
which is paper, including news-
print, which is getting too 
cockeyed expensive. If I have-
n't forgotten my Texas history, 
the first meeting of the Texas 
congress was held under a tree 
at Boston on the Brazos, and 
later the Mexican General San-
ta Anna was captured lying 
wounded under a tree by Sam 
Houston's Texans. I believe 
that tree still stands in West 
Columbia. Another use that 
trees were put to in the early 
days of this country was for the 
purpose of dispensing justice. 
Among other locations the 
hangman's tree is still standing 
at Goliad. We will never use 
our pecan tree for that purpose. 

Everyone should turn out for 
the tree planting program Sat-
urday. It is the first event in 
our local Bicentennial celebra-
tion. 

Congratulations to the Bob-
bies on winning the first half 
district championship. 

Birdwell will 
seek new term 

THE ENTHUSIASM of Dimmitt's students and fans was 
spelled out in two-foot letters Friday night as 3,300 packed into 
the Texan Dome at South Plains College in Levelland to see 
District 3-AA's "big shootout" between the Bobcats and 
Morton's Indians. It was a nip-and-tuck battle until the last 90 

Kenneth Wyatt, Tulia artist 
who is recognized throughout 
the United States for his west-
ern paintings and on the Knife 
and Fork Club circuit for his 
humorous philosophy, will be 
the speaker at the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce banquet 
Saturday evening. 

OTHER program highlights 
will be presentation of the 
Citizen of the Year award and 
recognition of all past presi-
dents of the chamber. 

The banquet is scheduled at 
7:30 p.m. in the Castro County 
Expo Center. Its theme is 
-Happy Birthday, America!" 

seconds, when the Indians rallied for a 49-42 victory. It was the 
Bobcats' first loss of the season. The two teams will meet again 
Feb. 3 in the South Plains Dome, in a battle that will be 
do-or-die for the Bobcats. 

'Texas Bicentennial  Community'  

Kent Birdwell announced 
this week that he will seek re-
election as tax assessor-collec-
tor of Castro County, subject to 
the May 1 Democratic primary 

BIRDWELL said, "In making 
thiS announcement to the peo-
ple of Castro County I would 
like to take this opportunity to 
thank all of you for the coop-
eration and kind regard you 
have shown me during the past 
17 years I have had the priv-
ilege of serving as your elected 
official. 

Clayton cancels 
appearance here 

Dimmitt gets state designation 
Dimmitt is now an official 

Texas Bicentennial Communi-
ty. 

ANNOUNCEMENT of the 

* 

tions under the chairmen of 
Heritage, Horizons and Festi-
vals Committees. 

THE HERITAGE Committee 
tentatively set June 21-July 4 
as dates for an antiques dis-
play. They discussed setting up 
occasional displays of old mili-
tary uniforms, quilts and other 
items in store windows. Plans 

New '76ers 
seek singers 

House Speaker Bill Clayton 
of Springlake, who was to have 
been a special guest at the 
Dimmitt Chamber of Com-
merce banquet Saturday night, 
will he unable to attend be-
cause of a family emergency. 

CLAYTON'S 20-year-old son, 
Tommy, was seriously injured 
in an auto accident Sunday 
night near Earth, and remains 
in serious condition in a Lub-
bock hospital. 

Clayton cancelled all appoint-
ments for the week to be with 
his son and wife. 

"If I am favored with elec-
tion to continue in office, I will 
constantly strive for an equit-
able assessment of the property 
in this county and work to 
improve the services rendered 
by the office. 

"I will continue to discharge 
the duties of the office in a 
courteous, friendly, business-
like manner to the best of my 
ability. 

"I will greatly appreciate 
your vote again on May 1, in 
my bid for re-election to the 
office of tax assessor-collector. 

Committee to 
study museum 
plan tonight 

Stock show plans 
to be laid tonight 

Parents class 
set to begin 

in progress for a County Mu-
seum were also reviewed. 

The Horizons Committee is 
in charge of a Liberty Tree 
planting Saturday. Painting 
fireplugs, planting red, white 
and blue flowers and placing 
posters around town are some 
of the other ideas they are 
working on, as well as the time 
capsule. 

Many details remain to be 
worked out by the Festivals 
Committee, which has set a 
meeting for 8 p.m. Feb. 12 in 
the City Hall assembly room. 
They are considering a Latin-
American Fiesta, a musical 
production by The '76ers, a 
camp-out and a display of old-
time arts and crafts. 

ANYONE interested in help-
ing on these committees or 
with a particular project is in-
vited to contact one of the 
chairmen: Heritage, Florene 
Leinen at 647-5534 or Mrs. 
Henderson, 647-4342; Hori-
zons, Linda Roberts, 647-4528; 
Festivals, Carolyn Watts, 647-
5615; or Mrs. Maxwell, general 
chairman. 

Dimmitt's city commission 
moved Monday night toward 
putting the city on an "alley 
box" system of garbage collec-
tion. 

GARBAGE cans and drums 
that now line the residential 
alleys would be replaced by 
large steel "neighborhood 
dumpster" boxes which can be 
hoisted and dumped into a 
specially equipped truck that's 
operated by only one man. 

At present, each of the city's 
two garbage trucks is manned 
by a driver and two collectors. 

City commissioners heard a 
presentation on the new system 
Monday night by the man 
whose company builds the steel 
boxes—Franklin Ebeling, own-
er of Emco Manufacturing Co. 
in Plainview. 

EBELING said the city would 
need 300 containers with a 
3-cu. yd. capacity and 150 with 
a 11/2 -cu. yd. capacity. One 
man in the specially equipped 
truck could "easily" collect all 
the garbage in the city's resi-
dential areas in three days' 
time, he said, allowing for 
twice-a-week pickups. 

Total cost of the new sys-
tem-450 boxes and a 1975 
model truck—is $96,000. The 
city could acquire the new 
system through a leasing cor-
poration for $5,000 down and 
lease payments of $1,922 per 
month or $5,096.12 per quar-
ter, Ebeling said. 

CITY Manager Garnett Hol-
land endorsed the system, say-
ing it would eliminate $15,000 
or more per year ih salaries 
while providing the city with a 
badly needed new garbage 
truck. 

Holland recommended that 
no present city workers be laid 
off if the new system is put into 
operation, though. He said the 
"normal attrition rate" and re-
assignment of workers would 
take care of the reduction in the 
number of city employees. 

Holland explained that the 
sanitation department—which 
has an annual payroll of $50,-
000—lost $27,000 last year, 
"and our expenses are growing 
all the time on the old trucks." 
The city uses two garbage 
trucks and one flatbed, which 
stay busy six days a week, Hol-
land said. 

HOLLAND recommended 
that the city's second compac-
tor truck remain in use for daily 
collections in the business dis-
trict. 

Ebeling told the commission 
that replacement of either of 
the city's two present trucks 
"would cost almost as much as 
the new side-lift truck, and 
you'd still be lifting barrels." 

Fifty-four other cities are 
using part or all of the Emco 
system now, Ebeling said. 

"Most cities have already 
had to stop using 55-gallon 
drums because of federal reg-
ulations," Mayor Elmer Youts 
commented. "We're still using 
them, but we're living on 
[See CITY FAVORS, Page 10] 

Fat Stock Show plans, taking 
shape as the date of the annual 
event nears, will be the prin-
cipal business at a meeting of 
the Castro County Young 
Farmers at 7:30 tonight (Thurs-
day) in the high school ag 
building. 

THE YOUNG Farmers, spon-
sors of the county stock show 
each year, are completing ar-
rangements and report that 
they are ready now to get the 
work started. This year's show 
is scheduled for Feb. 19-21. 

Anyone interested in helping 
with the event is invited to the 
meeting tonight. 

Beta Sigma Phi Sorority 
members are decorating the 
banquet hall, and the steak 
dinner will be catered by the 
new K-Bob's Steak House of 
Dimmitt. 

ENTERTAINMENT will in-
clude music by the Firehouse 
15 of Hereford, the group that 
performed in the 1971 Roundup 
Parade on the Oasis Shrine 
Club float. 

Wyatt is known in the Plains 
area as a speaker who mixes 
inspiration with humor, as well 
as a painter and sculptor whose 
art is accepted by professional 
critics and approved by ranch-
men of yesterday and today. 

His work has been purchased 
by prominent figures in the 
entertainment, political and 
business world, also for the 
collections of corporations, 
foundations, banks and indus-
trial firms. 

Interested in art since child-
hood, Wyatt turned to serious 
painting as a career only in 
recent years. He was formerly 
a United Methodist minister 
who held pastorates at Padu-
cah, Morton, Chillicothe, Tex-. 
line and Tulia, and before that 
he had various jobs including 
ranch hand and sailor in the US 
Navy. 

A WYATT painting tells a 
story, and its authenticity to 
the western locale is attested 
by praise from oldtime cow-
hands and modern cattlemen. 
The painter won the 1970 West 
Texas Chamber of Commerce 
Cultural Achievements award. 

He will be introduced by Jer-
ry Marvin, who will serve as 
emcee of the banquet. Dim-
mitt's Citizen of the Year, who 
has already been selected, will 
be introduced by Jimmie Ross. 
Rev. John Street, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church, will give 
the invocation. 

Bob Caddell, retiring cham-
ber president, will pass the 
gavel to the new president, 
Jack Edwards, after introduc-
ing the board of directors and 
giving special recognition to 
the retiring directors, Chet 
Braafladt, Jerry Cluck and 
Donald Wright. 

NEW directors coming onto 
the board—Gene Latham, 
Jackie Clark and Bob Anthony 
—will be introduced by Ed-
wards. 

Continuing in directors' 
posts are Robert McLean, Walt 
Hansen, Dale Fowler, Doug 
Lapins, Robert Ryan, Bill 
Clark, Edwards, Marvin and 
Caddell. 

Guests will be introduced 
and past presidents recognized 
by Ryan. In keeping with the 
Bicentennial theme, the pro-
gram will end with the singing 
of "God Bless America" by the 
audience. 

'Liberty tree' 
to be planted 

Experience of a neighboring 
town in conducting a successful 
county museum project will be 
related at a meeting of the 
Castro County Historical Com-
mittee at 7 o'clock tonight 
(Thursday) in the city hall com-
munity room. 

MRS. HENRY Sears, the or-
iginal promoter and director of 
the Deaf Smith County His-
torical Museum, will be present 
to tell the group how Hereford 
people worked to get their 
project started. 

All residents interested in a 
Castro County museum are 
urged by Helen Richardson, 
committee chairman, to attend 
the meeting. 

Brief reports will be given 
regarding efforts toward locat-
ing a site, Mrs. Richardson 
said, and a resume of discus-
sion with the county commis-
sioners' court will be present-
ed. 

join 

tour 
Local singer to 
Justin Wilson's 

designation, received from Sam 
Kinch of Austin, chairman of 
the American Revolution Bi-
centennial Commission of Tex-
as, was made at a Dimmitt Bi-
centennial Committee meeting 
last Thursday. 

The notice from Austin add-
ed, "Your application will now 
be forwarded to the American 
Revolution Bicentennial Ad-
ministration in Washington, 
D.C., for ultimate endorsement 
as a National Bicentennial 
Community." 

Sent to Linda Maxwell, chair-
man of the Dimmitt committee, 
the letter from the state chair-
man congratulated the local 
committee members on "the 
scope of your programming" 
and said, "The quality of your 
application is a credit to you as 
chairman and to the many 
members of your committee." 

VARIED activities suggested 
for the Bicentennial observance 
here were discussed, and other 
suggestions heard at the recent 
meeting when 37 persons were 
present, including 21 new 
members representing 11 addi-
tional organizations, communi-
ties and ethnic groups. 

More representatives are still 
wanted, Mrs. Maxwell said as 
she stressed, "We want every 
citizen to have a part in this 
yearlong celebration. We're not 
limiting action to the ideas that 
have already been presented, 
and we'll welcome additional 
suggestions and help." 

After general discussion, the 
group divided into three sec- 

Rehearsals will begin 
Monday by The '76ers, the 
Castro County Bicentennial 
Chorus which chose that 
name and selected Jim Mas-
sey as director at a recent 
meeting. 

MASSEY, director of mu-
sic and education in the 
First United Methodist 
Church here, will be assist-
ed by Charles Higgs, music 
and education director in the 
First Baptist Church. 

Rehearsal is scheduled at 
7:30 p.m. Monday in the 
First United Methodist 
Church. Residents who are 
interested in singing with 
this group are invited to be 
present then. 

Organization of The '76ers 
is being sponsored by the 
Town and Country Home 
Demonstration Club. The 
chorus is still open for mem-
bers, both men and women. 

THE CHORUS is being 
formed to take part in var-
ious community programs 
during the Bicentennial 
year. Members are wanted 
from all parts of Castro 
County. 

Parents and those who work 
professionally with children are 
invited to register for a Parent 
Effectiveness Course to be held 
at the Mental Health Outreach 
Center, 412 NW Third St., 
beginning at 7 p.m. Tuesday. 

THE WORKSHOP-type 
course will be held on eight 
consecutive Tuesdays. The 
number of participants will be 
limited, according to Judy Bird-
well, outreach worker, so those 
interested are asked to notify 
the center, 647-2409, to be 
registered. 

Parent Effectiveness Train-
ing is a laboratory course in 
which parents learn not only 
what to do but how to do it, 
Mrs. Birdwell explained. It is 
equally useful to teachers, 
school counselors and ministers 
who work with young people, 
she added. 

Time will be given for dis-
cussion, but parents are not 
asked to reveal family prob-
lems, Mrs. Birdwell said, 
stressing that this is not a form 
of group therapy or sensitivity 
training. 

By SUE COLEMAN 

* 

Wyatt's artwork 

to be displayed 

offer for the spring engage-
ment. 

"THESE people are 
great, and I'm tickled to 
death at the chance to work 
with them," Mrs. Morris 
said this week. 

Present plans are for her 
husband, Doyle, to fly with 
her to Houston and make a 
special vacation trip of the 
tour. The singer's birthday 
is March 15 and she says the 
tour will be "a big celebra-
tion, in advance." 

She calls this "a second 
chance" because she was 
offered a similar engage-
ment with another show in 
1963 but turned it down. 

Her oldest son, Dee, was 
a baby then and she did not 
want to leave him. 

Ceti oKap 

A 'NEW LOOK' to Dimmitt's First United 
Methodist Church is indicative of the con-
tinued growth and construction here. The 
annex will house a choir room and all-weather 
entrance port, and extensive remodeling is 
also being done in the Lamar Fellowship Hall 
area inside the north wing. In other construc-
tion projects, the new refinery at the Dimmitt 

[Readings recorded at 7 a.m. 
daily for the preceding 24 
hours.] 

Hi 	Lo 
Thursday 	 49 	8 
Friday 	 67 	23 
Saturday 	 58 	31 
Sunday 	68 24 
Monday 	 71 28 
Tuesday 	 42 	9 
Wednesday 	 54 	20 
1976 Moisture 	  Tr. 

KDHN 
US Weather Observer 

NOW THE blonde singer, 
who lives on a farm west of 
Dimmitt, has three sons. 
The youngest, Gabe, is 4 
years old and Jayson is 9, so 
she can leave them with rel-
atives while she is gone a 
week. 

Mrs. Morris has no ambi-
tion for a career as a pro- 

[See LOCAL SINGER, Page 17] 

"I'm excited! I've always 
wanted to do something like 
this, and now I have a sec-
ond chance after passing up 
one 12 years ago," vivacious 
Patsy Morris says of an en-
gagement to appear with 
Justin Wilson's "Country 
Cajun Caravan" in March. 

THE DIMMITT woman, 
who frequently sings on lo-
cal programs and in other 
West Texas cities, is to join 
the Caravan show March 8 
at Houston and sing with it 
on a week-long Texas tour 
that will include an appear-
ance in Amarillo. 

Surprise was her reaction 
when she was offered the 
show spot, she says. Mrs. 
Morris was one of several 
area entertainers who took 
part in a program here 
Saturday night featuring 
Justin Wilson, widely-known 
"Cajun humorist." 

After she sang at the re-
hearsal session, Wilson told 
her he liked her presentation 
and his tour manager would 
contact her, she said. The 
next day, she received the 

Dimmitt's first official Bi-
centennial program will be a 
tree-planting ceremony at 1:30 
p.m. Saturday on the southeast 
corner of the courthouse lawn. 

THE PUBLIC is invited to 
the program to be held on the 
east steps of the courthouse. 

The tree, a young pecan 
which is the state tree of Texas, 
will be supplied by the Texas 
Forestry Association. 

Linda Roberts, chairman of 
the Horizons Subcommittee of 
the Bicentennial Committee, 
will give a brief address and 
Elvon DeVaney, Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce man-
ager, will plant the tree. Mayor 
Elmer Youts will also speak 
briefly and Don Nelson will 
lead the audience in singing 
"America.' ' 

PECAN TREES for planting 
in observance of the US Bi-
centennial were given to all 
cities in Texas which are of-
ficially designated as Bicenten-
nial Communities. The pro-
gram here, originally planned a 
week earlier on Texas' Arbor 
Day, was postponed by a delay 
in arrival of the tree. 

This Bicentennial pecan is 
called a "Liberty Tree" after 
the famous elm in colonial Bos-
ton under which the first act of 
public resistance to British rule 
occurred in 1765, according to 
Linda Maxwell, Dimmitt Bi-
centennial chairman. 

Amstar Plant is taking shape; Schaeffer & 
Co., CPA, has completed an annex to its 
eight-year-old building that doubled its size; 
remodeling is underway on a downtown 
building where another new restaurant will 
open soon; and new-home construction is 
continuing at a healthy pace. 

Western art by Kenneth Wy-
att will be on display to the 
public from 1 to 5 p.m. Sunday 
in the Castro County Country 
Club, in conjunction with 
Wyatt's appearance here Sat-
urday as speaker at the annual 
Chamber of Commerce ban-
quet. 

The Chamber of Commerce 
will sponsor the show of 
Wyatt's work and invites all 
area residents to see it without 
charge. 

Wyatt, whose home is in 
Tulia, is widely known for his 
western paintings and sculp-
ture featuring men and animals 
in authentic backgrounds. 



CURTIS AND Marie Tate 
came home from a trip to 
Woodward, Okla. and Ponca 
City, where they visited Ma-
rie's relatives. Her mother 
Mrs. J. L. Kay came home with 
them, and this week they are in 
Amarillo babysitting the dogs 
while daughter Pat and Ken 
Truelove are in Houston where 
they will be moving soon. Ken 
was transferred there by Am-
erican Bakeries. The son is still 
in the Navy. 

Soapy Holland came in from 
Austin, Nev. to visit his mother 

Mortgage Life Insurance 

Friday & Saturday 
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Sheffg's chatter 

Mrs. Bellinghausen home from homecoming in Italy 
By MYRTLE SHEFFY her sister and family. And 

Lynda Parker teaches special 
reading for the third and fourth 
grades. Another teacher is Sha-
ron Goode and Donna Driggers 
teaches special education at the 
junior high. Probably 25 more I 
don't know. 

Bill and Teresa Johnson 
moved here recently from 
Plainview. They have a mobile 
home at 626 NW Sixth Street in 
the Andrews Park. They go to 
the Church of Christ. He is 
with Paxton Tire Co. Teresa is 
with the Chevrolet company. 

now? Jim is vice president of 
the Federal Land Bank. Saw 
another sister Helen at Roscoe 
and Norma and Harold Glad-
man at Plainview. 

Dana Umberson Adair, a 
student at Eastern New Mexico 
University, was a Sunday guest 
of grandmother Alma Umber-
son at South Hills Manor. Dana 
will join her husband Lt. Rod-
ney Adair at Ft. Benning, Ga. 
very soon. 

Maria West went to Friona to 
visit Mrs. Anita Van Tyle. 
Maria is a nurse at South Hills 
Manor, as is Sharon Leinen. 
Her company is her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. John Leinen of 
Montana. They also visit son 
Don and go out to the home 
and visit the folks. 

Dorothy Elder's birthday was 
Sunday so the Colonial Inn 
Restaurant was the place for 
dinner for her, Jim, daughter 
Trudy and Richard Jackson 
with Mrs. 0. K. Howe as the 
hostess. 

Ann Ethington was a birth-
day girl Sunday, so husband 
Don took her and daughter 
Elaine and daughter Jaime and 
husband Lloyd Hamilton and 
baby Miquela of Odessa out to 
dinner. Lloyd is with the big 
Mobil gas there. 

Flo Lust says she had a good 
time skiiing at Red River, "No 
broken bones.-  She saw the 
Alfred Sammanns, the Wayne 
Jacksons and more folks from 

Proven Nationwide! 

products 
for faster, easier, more economical land forming 

Rosetta Bellinghausen is 
home from a three-week visit in 
Italy where she saw all of her 
family and the relatives of Rose 
Acker. The towns are Pompeii, 
Salerino. They had open house 
one day so all the friends could 
come by for a visit. She saw 
and heard the Opera in San 
Carlos in Naples, went to the 
theatre to see "The Rule of the 
Father." It was a mobile crib 
with much play of light and 
dark. They saw the ships but 
Rosetta flew over there. A 
friend has written a book called 
"One Night One Life," which 
should be in the United States 
soon. 

Automatic Levelers 

Hours will be from 10 to 11:30 
a.m. All friends are invited. 
There will be no invitations 
mailed. 

Rex and Joyce Carlile of 
Abilene were recent weekend 
guests of his uncle Horace and 
Ceal Carlile. Another day Mrs. 
Carlile went to Lubbock to 
check on her sick brother-in-
law Mike and her sister Boot-
sie, both have been ill. 

Opal Bearden was hostess 
with bridge and good food last 
Thursday. Her guests were 
Jeanie Miller, Ceal Carlile, 
Gladys Cleavinger, Maggie Bo-
ren, Ruth Wooten, Cletha 
George, Anita Morris, Dorothy 
Elder. Ceal and Anita won high 
scores. 

Hydraulic Scrapers 

Faye Holland and wife Velma, 
who is spending the winter 
here. Velma is working with 
Clara Vick at the abstract 
office. 

David and Ann Hays have 
had company all week. A niece 
Genene Herrington of Amarillo 
and the Kenneth Frye family of 
Easter were here. Linda Frye 
and Ann were college room-
mates. * 

JACK SUMMERS has mov-
ed from his big house to the 
little house just west facing 
Bedford Street. The big house 
is being redecorated and is now 
owned by stepsons Jack and 
Bill Gladman of Amarillo. 

I am just now meeting some 
of the pretty school teachers. 
Saw them shopping downtown. 
Karen Lilley went to Colorado 
Springs with friends to ski, fell 
and fractured her arm. She is 
engaged to Mikey May of 
Oklahoma. The wedding will be 
next summer. And Linda Mc-
Kneely teaches fourth and fifth 
grades. Early childhood studies 
(whatever that is). She went to 
Abilene last weekend to visit 

* 

for precision land smoothing and improved 
Idlage 	utiliring the famous Eversman luny 
automatic leveling action four models avail 
able in 32" and 40 length 10' and 12" wide 
cutting blades All models operated with regu 
tar farm tractors 

HOUSTON, the biggest city 
of the South, was the place 
where the Young Farmers and 
Young Homemakers went last 
week for a meeting. I think 14 
couples went down: Charles 
and Sue Summers (grand's 
Melvin and Juanita kept the 
boy), Graham and Karen Shef-
fy (grands Ted and Dorothy 
kept the boy), Bruce and Nancy 
Fuller, Ronnie and Kay Gfeller, 
Arlie and Doris Petty, Don and 
Paralyn Moore, Rex and 
Shanee Lust, Howard and 
Maretta Smithson, Glen and 
Beth Odom, Richard and Char-
lene Hunter, Danny and Bren-
da Bruton, Glen Schumacher (a 
bachelor) and Larry Gray (not 
married). Several went on to 

New Rear Blades 

Big 6 yard capacity with single unit or 12 yard 
tandem model for 65 HP or larger tractors 
Also 2 1 2 yard model or 5 yard tandem for 45 
HP tractors Only single control valve needed 
Hitches to standard drawbar High transport 
clearance loads and spreads fast and easy 

Ditchers 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 

A quality heavy duty tear grader blade with 
complete hydraut.: control of the blade angling 
and tilting from the tractor seat. A lull 10 
wide blade for agricultural or industrial use 
on large wheel tractors 

Build or clean ditches up to 7' wide 33" deep 
Rubber mounted or 3 point hitch models 
Mechanical or hydraulic control One man 
operation Easily transported low power re 
Quirements Handled by standard farm trac 
tors There are 5 models available Call: 

Kent Birda cll' 
Illi F.. Jones Si. 
Phon • t'17 ' 

Come in Today For Full Details 
300 West Bedford 

Ph. 647-4464 Dimmitt, Tex. 
State Farm Life Insurance Company 

Home Office Slocrringlyn, Illinois 

here. 
* 

MR. AND MRS. Gordon 
Fore and daughter Janis have 
been in Kansas visiting rela-
tives. Gordon is manager of Joe 
Butler's business, or one of 
them. 

Lindy and Lura Scarbrough 
of Amarillo were Sunday guests 
of friends Mary Booher and 
Ruby Coke. All were neighbors 
at Flagg a few years ago. 

Ray Sheffy Jr. had been in 
the hospital with a broken 
hand, received the break on the 
job at the highway department. 

Fred and Helen Kuntz flew 
down to Acapulco, Mexico 
Monday for a weeks vacation as 
guests of one of the fertilizer 
companies. They will have 
tours of the city and that part of 
the country. Probably have the 
yacht tour around the bay, one 
of the perfect natural bays, 
they tell us. 

And Delton and Sue Tishler 
went to Fort Worth this week to 
attend the Texas Plant Food 
Institute. Isn't that a fine 
phrase to call fertilizer. They 
will have banquets and shows. 

Oren and June Brock have 
been keeping Janice while her 
dad Jess Hutcherson is in 
Northwest Texas Hospital for a 
checkup or treatment. Thelma 
has been with him. 

VAUDINE GILES came to 
town from Dalhart. She visited 
her daughter Jan Hargrove and 
husband, also friends Neva 
Hickey and Juanita Bruegel. 
Think they may have gotten in 
a few holes of golf. 

Opal Jarvis of Plainview was 
flap %Owed Co.. 

a Saturday visitor of cousins 
Birdie Neill and Waurayne 
Hughes and me. Opal and I 
went to the same parties when 
we were 17. Were we ever that 
young? I remember the days as 
fun. 

Another pretty school teach-
er is Melinda Maness. She says 
she is single, from Amarillo, a 
recent graduate of WTSU, 
teaches at the new elementary, 
goes to the Methodist Church. 

Joyce Kendrick of Austin and 
a student at WTSU has been a 
guest of Virginia Sheffy this 
week. Joyce was a member of a 
wedding party at Canyon and 
did not wish to drive back to 
Austin. 

Calvin and Tommie Petty 
and Frank and Louise Mears 
have been to Falcon Lake for a 
couple of weeks. They stayed at 
Zapata and crossed the Rio 
Grande and shopped some of 
the Mexican towns. Tommie 
says they caught a few fish but 
the fishing wasn't too good. 

LAST FRIDAY Shirley Steph-
ens was hostess to their needle-
point club with a luncheon in 
her home. Those enjoying 
working on their needlepoint 
and fun conversation were 
Nancy Hays of Hereford, Myr-
tle Lois Moran, Carole Dyer 
and Esta Vandiver. Sue Merritt 
was unable to come and Dor-
othy Sheffy, who is also a 
member of this club, was 
teaching school. 

There will be a bridal shower 
honoring Leigh Ann Roark, 
daughter of Rev. and Mrs. 
Marvin Roark, in the home of 
Mrs. George Sides Jan. 24. 

WORD POWER! 
IGLESIA DE CRISTO 
E. Lee and S.E. Third 

Evangelists — Miguel Zuniga 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m 
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all 	 7:30 p.m; 

IGLESIA BAUTISTA 
JOE BAILES MEMORIAL 

300 N.E. 7th 
Pastor Van Earl Hughes 
Secretaria Sara Salinas 

Tesorero Gabriel Montiel 
Estudios Biblicos.... 10:00 a.m 
El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

One of our popular publications, encourages the learning of new words, 
and in each edition prints a few words that we can 

add to our vocabulary. 

Words have swayed thousands, even changed the course of 
history. It is through the use of words that men are saved. 

''For after that in the wisdwn of God the world by wisdwn knew 
not God, it pleased God by the foolishness of pieachiny 

save them that believe."... "Because 
the foolishness of God is (riser than men." 

A TT N D CHURCH . HEAP GOD'S WORD 

Galveston and NASA and other 
side trips. 

Don and Ann Ethington are 
home from a recent trip to the 
Northeast. Ann calls it their 
Bicentennial tour. They stop-
ped in Washington, D.C., 
made all the tours, the high-
light there was the evening 
trip to the White House. The 
Christmas trees were still up 
with the beautiful decorations 
and the White House orchestra 
played all the holiday songs. 
On to Boston, on to Philadel-
phia, saw the early day things, 
on to New York City. She loved 
the city. At night from the big 
bridge the lights of the giant 
town were fantastic. The peo-
ple never stop, it seems, night 
or day. They went on to 
Augusta to visit Don's son Don 
Jr. She didn't like it there 
because it is too cold, but a trip Cadet 
to a fishing village in Camden, 
Maine was nice. Had a treat 
meal of fresh fish. They made on honor 

19 states, glad to be home, and 
ready to go some place else 
now. Don is with Western 
Ammonia. 

* 

JACK AND Myrna Cowsert 
had a good visiting trip to 
South Texas. They saw sister 
Jo at Houston, Mary at Corpus 
Christi and did you know their 
son Jim and Jan are in Houston 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 
Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 
Bible School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship and 

Lord's Supper 	 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Study 	 8.00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
5th and Halsell 

Jim Hedrick, Pastor 
Sunday-7  
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship... 	11:00 a.m. 
NYPS 	 6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service.... 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 
Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6. 00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Choir Rehearsal 	 8:10 p.m. 

Loren Vandiver 

Vandiver 

list 
Charles Loren Vandiver, son 

of Dr. and Mrs. Charles M. 
Vandiver of 707 W. Lee St., 
earned President's List honors 
for the fall semester at New 
Mexico Military Institute at 
Roswell. 

VANDIVER is a high school 
junior in his second year at 
NMMI. 

In addition to a B-plus av-
erage or above in academic 
subjects, cadets on the Presi-
dent's List must earn A's in 
military science and deport-
ment, demonstrate school citi-
zenship and leadership. 

Because of these high stand-
ards, just above 10 percent of 
the cadet corps achieve the 
honor listing at NMMI. 

Phone 647-3239 

For Starting Time 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
DEL PRIMOJENITO 

East Halsell St. 
Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Sermon 	  11:00 a.m. 
Lord's Supper and 
Feet Washing 	 11:30 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	7. 30 p.m. 
Wednesday Services.. 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Marvin Roark, Pastor 
Jim Massey, Music & Education 

110 S.W. 3rd — Ph. 647-4356 
Sunday— 
Sunday School. ..... 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship.. ..10:45 a.m. 
MYF, Jr. Hi & Sr. Hi.. 5:30 p.m. 

6'30 p.m. Evening Worship 
Wednesday—
General Meeting, 
WSCS 

Sunday & Monday 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
(Northside) 

Third and Halsell Streets 
Leonard Tittle, Minister 

Phone 647-5284 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship....10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6•00 p.m.  
Wednesday— 
Ladies Class 	 2:00 p.m. 
Mid-Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

9.30 a.m. 

SS representative 

schedules visit 
Business with the Social Se-

curity Administration may be 
transacted by Castro County 
residents at the courthouse 
Monday beginning at 9 a.m. 

A SSA representative will be 
here that day to discuss Social 
Security business and answer 
inquiries. Visits of the repre-
sentative are scheduled here 
for first, third and fourth Mon-
days of each month. 

At other times service may 
be obtained at the Social Se-
curity office at 1401-B West 5th 
St.. Plainview. 

"ON ANY 
SUNDAY" 

choir 	  7:30 p.m. 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

412 North East Street 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship. . . 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m.  
Monday W M U 	4:30 p.m. 
Tuesday Brotherhood 	 7:55 p.m. 
Wednssday 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 

Sanctuary Choir 	 Friday 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
William E. Summers, Pastor 

302 S.E. 2nd 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Christ Ambassadors and 
Children's Church 	 6:00 p.m. 

Evangelistic Service 	 7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service.... 7:30 p.m. 

The Church is God s appointed agency in this world for spreading the knowledge of His love 

for mon and of His demand for mun to respond to that love by loving his neighbor Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no government or society or woy of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so dear will inevitably perish Therefore, even 

from a selfish point of view, one should support the Church for the sake of the welfare 

of himself and his family. Beyond that, however, every person should uphold and par-

ticipate in the Church because it tells the truth about mon s life, death and destiny, the 

truth which alone will set him free to live cis a child of God OcnistO 
SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 

CHURCH 
Raymond Jones, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday Night— 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 p.m. 

LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Bobby Gordon, Pastor 
Phone 647-2300 

Sunday— 
Sunday School.... 	. 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services... 8:00 p.m. 

CARLILE 
fTheatze 

Dimmitt, Texas 
PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 

Western Circle Drive 
Rev. Ed Manning, Minister 

Sunday— 
Church School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Common Worship. 	11:00 a.m. 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 
1001 W. Halsell — Ph. 647-4219 
Sunday— 
Mass in English 	7.00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	 10:30 a.m. 
Religion Classes 	9.30 a.m. 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday— 
Mass 	  7:00 a.m. 
Holy Days— 
Mass in English 	7.00  a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	8'00  p.m. 
Confessions— 
Friday 	.... 7. 00 to 8:00 p.m. 
Baptism by Appointment 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
NE 7th & Andrews 

Fred Joiner, Minister 
647-4261 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services. 	8. 30 p.m 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 

Viggo Ulrich, Minister 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship....10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 	7'30 p.m. 

NEW ' ,OPE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.30 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services... 7:30 p.m. 

AFTER 14 YEARS - WE'RE 
LOSING OUR SECRETARY! 

Because of retirement, we are now 

looking for a permanent secretary. 

Skills must include typing, payroll, 

and some bookeeping knowledge. 

PERMANENCE is a must, 

preferabty a woman. 

A good challenge with medical, 

Pension, and Profit sharing priviledges. 

Killingsworth Construction 
Company, Inc. 

Dimmitt, Texas 	 (806) 647-3141 

Published Through the Cooperation of the Local Ministerial Association and Sponsored by the Undersigned Individuals and Business Institutions 

HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. 

SEALE FLORIST 
Phone 647-3554 

FLOYD'S TIRE SHOP 

CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 

DIMMITT '66' INC. 
Chet Braatladt 

C&S EQUIPMENT CO. 

HAYS IMPLEMENT 

WESTERN AMMONIA CORP. 

FIRST STATE BANK 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 

DIMMITT TV CABLE 

DENNIS FLORAL- & GIFTS 
Across From the Hospital 

647-3197 



48 oz. bottle 
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DHS junior to attend 
Washington 'classroom' PURSE PLEASING run! 

Annita Parker, a junior in 
Dimmitt High School, has been 
selected to attend the Presi-
dential Classroom for Young 
Americans in Washington, 
D.C., the week of Feb. 21-28. 

THE DAUGHTER of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Parker will join 
other high school students from 
all parts of the nation to live for 
a week in a Washington-area 
hotel and attend seminars and 
discussion groups led by key 
officials in the US capitol. 

For several years the Dim-
mitt community has participat-
ed in this program, which 
began nationally in 1968 and 
has taken over 11,000 students 
on visits to the capitol city. 

Supported in the past by 
civic and school organizations, 
the program is included in 
United Way funding for the 
coming year. 

MISS PARKER will have an 
opportunity to hear key Wash-
ington officials speak, and to 
take part in seminars where 
she may question the speakers 
in the fashion of the news con-
ferences which are frequently 
seen on television. 

Past speakers have included 
Senators, Congressmen, Su-
preme Court justices, cabinet 
secretaries, members of the 
Joint Chiefs of Staff, White 
House staff members, foreign 
ambassadors, members of the 
news media and Federal agen-
cy representatives. 

The students will study all 
three branches of the govern-
ment to gain a better under-
standing of the issues and 
personalities which influence 
the conduct of national political 
affairs. 

STUDENTS themselves have 

BUCCANEER STAMPS* DOUBLE ON WEDNESDAYS 

SPECIALS GOOD JANUARY 22 THRU 28, 1976 

Annita Parker 

TOILET TISSUE 
Zee 4 roll 

reported in the past that they 
considered equally important 
the exchange of ideas and 
points of view with other stu-
dents from distant areas of the 
country. 

When she returns Miss Par-
ker will share her experience 
by speaking to various groups 
in the Dimmitt schools and 
community. 

tICIHOUr 

Presidential Classroom offi-
cials have announced that all 
available spaces for the 1976 
High School program have 
been filled, but applications for 
the Summer Classroom pro-
gram are being accepted. 

The summer program is de-
signed to meet the needs of 
educators, administrators, gov-
ernment employees and college 
students of political science or 
government, rather than high 
school students. 

CURITY DIAPERS 
30 Daytime or 24 Toddler 

CRISCO OIL 
ZEE TOWELS 

large rolls 

Uiew  from the Library 

1111 
By CARLTON MOYERS 

Librarian 
energy into millions of pro-
ducts, not the least of which is 
the internal combustion engine. 

THE INTERNAL combustion 
engine is at the heart of a host 
of industrial applications and a 
majority of agricultural opera-
tions. Without internal com-
bustion engines to power farm 
machinery, we'd be left with 
animal-powered implements 
and low production. 

Two great types of produc-
tion, agricultural and indus-
trial, depend on each other for 
survival. Industry wouldn't sur-
vive without food for its work-
ers and agriculture wouldn't 
set production records without 
the implements of industry. 

Farmers look with disdain 
upon many of the results of 
urban life and the city dweller 
returns similar feelings. At 
times the situation approaches 
tragic proportions which pits 
farm against city to the benefit 
of neither. 

THERE NEEDS to be an 
awareness on both sides: that 
of cities and industry that the 
city needs agriculture and that 
the farmers need industry. I 
look at the vast sweep of life in 
America with all its complex-
ities and intertwining relation-
ships and see a need for under-
standing between the various 
and sundry groups of people in 
this country for the survival of 
the people in the "Spirit of 
'76.- 

This column may not seem to 
be a "view from the library" 
but one purpose of the library 
is continuing education. What 
better education is there than 
one which suggests a hope for 
society by pointing up a prob-
lem and also a solution? The 
library offers to bring both 
sides together by aiding under-
standing which leads to wis-
dom. Thomas Jefferson, I hope 
you understand and approve. 
Thanks for starting us. 

Kraft quart 

$ MIRACLE WHIP 1 1 3  
HAMS 

Wilson's Boneless Pit 

GROUND BEEF 
Fresh Ground Extra Lean 

GERMAN SAUSAGE 
Gooch 12 oz. pkg. 

SUPER SUDS 
42 oz. box 

Mrs. Tuckers 3 lb. can 	
09 

SHORTENING 
AVOCADOS 

Del more 

MORN SUNS ORANGES Sunkist Navels Sibs. 
CORN 

Fresh Flordia Ear 
JOAN 
of ARC 

1976 is to be a year of 
reflection on the past and con-
templation of the future. While 
the emphasis will be on our be-
ginnings as a nation, the spirit 
which led thoughtful p6ople to 
disagree with each other and 
England is alive today and in 
many places. 

THE "SPIRIT of '76" usually 
is interpreted as a courage in 
combat and demonstrated by 
soldiers in Revolutionary War 
uniforms carrying the flag and 
marching to fife and drum. 
There's another aspect of the 
Spirit of '76; more subtle and 
harder to detect but still a vital 
and important force in our 
civilization. 

The "Spirit of '76" has 
always led people to look at 
their country with a view to-
ward preserving all that ap-
pears good and just and to 
search for solutions to those 
areas of conflict which seem to 
permeate society. 

It is with a sense of patriotic 
duty and love of country and 
hope for the future that I ask 
you to consider, in the Spirit of 
'76, a deep fracture in our 
society which has grown along 
with the United States. 

OUR SOCIETY can be class-
ified into many categories by 
countless disciplines and usual-
ly is. I wish to add to the 
number with one I've been ob-
serving closely for about three 
months since first arriving in 
Castro County. 

The majority of the people in 
Castro County are involved in 
agriculture, an enterprise 
which has become much more 
efficient in this country. The 
person involved in agriculture 
works with soil and water, 
seeing the rest of society as 
dependent on products from 
the soil. 

A larger segment of the pop-
ulation is involved in industry 
and related occupations, op-
erating the most powerful in-
dustrial machine in the world. 
Industrial America transforms 

"IF A MAN could have half 
his wishes he would double his 
troubles." — Benjamin Frank-
lin. 

.tr-ar********************************* 

COFFEE Folger's 3 lb. can $ 	99 

PM-MON/1\1E48;1 9  

ORANGE JUICE 

for 

j Flav-R-Pac 6 oz. 

4 
* : 
if  

4, 	. MR•BURGER 4, 	 4, .  ... Thanks to the people of 4 
Dimmitt fora fantastic welcome. * 

4 
We look forward to serving you *  * * 

finest in fast-food service. * * * 
in the future with the 	4' if 	 * * 4 

THANKS AGAIN! 
r*********************************** 
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1••••••••••••••••••••11' •••••••••••••.••••••• 
1-REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND 

•••••••••••••••••••••, G•••••••••••••••••••• •••••••••••••••••••00 ,  

_8-SERVICES 14-CARD OF THANKS 
••••••••••••••••••••0 
DEAD STOCK removal, 7-day 
week service. Please call soon 
as possible. Hereford Bi-Pro-
ducts. Phone 364-0951. 

8-27-tfc 

)••••••••••••••••••••4  ice ........ 
Farm Featua 

1-REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND 

5-FARM EQUIPMENT •••••••••••••.••••••• 
"IF YOU are serious about 
better more efficient land use, 
even water and fertilizer distri-
bution, you can't do without a 
RAYNE LAND PLANE.". Ask 
your implement dealer or call, 
512-732-5491 	5-15-11tc 

TRACTOR for sale-1972 Ford 
"9000" diesel. Clean, low 
hours. With Ford 4-16" mold-
board spinner plow. Call 
647-5657. 	 5-13-tfc 

FOR SALE: Miller Offset 
Discs. For free demonstration 
contact Farmer's Supply Co. 
647-3350. 	 5-41-tfc 

FOR SALE: Hog feeding equip-
ment. Lots of bargains. Tom 
Draper, 12 miles north of Dim-
mitt on Highway 385. 276-5263. 

5-16-3tc 

Avai able Material Dictated 
Early Farm Family's Clothing 

SPECIALISTS IN 

FARMS & RANCHES 
We have many qualified 
buyers for all types of land. 

WE NEED LISTINGS! 
We still have several farms 
listed in Castro, Parmer, 
Deaf Smith and Randall 
Counties-both irrigated 
and dryland. 

504 NW 7th - 3 bedroom, 
bath and 3/4 , 1 car garage. 
central heat. 	$22,500 

•••••••••••••••••••••1 
PUBLISHER'S 	NOTICE: 
All real estate advertised in 
this newspaper is subject to 
the Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference, 
limitation, or discriminatiOn 
based on race, color, religion. 
sex, or national origin, or an 
intention to make any such pre-
ference, limitation, or discrim-
ination." 
This newspaper will not know-
ingly accept any advertising 
for real estate which is in vio-
lation of the law. Our readers 
are informed that all dwell-
ings advertising in this news-
paper are available on an equal 
opportunity basis. 
1-28-tfc 

•••••••••••••••••••••41 

CARD OF THANKS 
The Castro County Lucky 7 

CB Club is grateful to all the 
businesses and individuals who 
contributed toward the pur-
chase of supplies for our Holi-
day Rest Stop during the 
Christmas and New Year's hol-
iday driving periods. 

Your help was very much 
appreciated by the members of 
the CCL-7 Club and also by the 
holiday travelers who took a 
break from their driving and 
experienced Dimmitt's hospi-
tality. 

There were no serious acci-
dents in the Dimmitt area 
during the holidays, and we 
like to think the Holiday Rest 
Stop might have been one of 
the reasons. 

Thanks again for your coop-
eration. 

•••••••••••••••••••••• 

CUSTOM DISKING, flatbreak-
ing,-  fertilizing and spraying, 
647-5548. 	 8-52-52tp• 

TREE SPRAYING, custom tree 
and landscape service. T. J. 
Carter, Tex. lic. PCL-1440Pt-
LOW. Amarillo 373-4593. Dim-
mitt representative Randy Gilli- 
land, 647-2448. 	8-23-tfc 

SEE YOUR independent in-
surance agent for complete in-
surance service. Ivey Insurance 
Agency, 210 W. Bedford, 647-' 
3518. 	 8-6-tfc 

SPUDDER RIG WORK: Earl 
Mahler, 806-945-2281. 8-3-34tp 

WANTED: Housecleaning jobs. 
647-2204, ask for Patsy. 

8-15-3tp 
6- AUTOMOTIVE 

GEORGE 
REAL 

ESTATE 

Americans today grow up in 
centrally heated homes and 
with warm clothing to face the 
rigors of winter weather. Colo-
nial settlers, especially the 
pioneering farmers, had only 
fireplaces to warm them, often 
had very few really warm 
outer clothing and no under-
wear at all. Then as now, 
people complained about the 
weather. But they had a rea-
son. 

coldest of garments, and when 
it dried it stiffened into a kind 
of mobile prison. ". . . the 
cold and clammy buckskin, 
saturated with water, clung 
fast to our limbs," Francis 
Parkman wrote about being 
caught in overnight rain on 
the Great Plains. "The light 
wind and sunshine soon dried 
it . 	. and then we were all 
encased in armor of intol-
erable stiffness." 

husband's broadcloth coat, 
which he had worn at his 
wedding and treasured for a 
lifetime, the woman of the 
home made all garments for 
the family; her spinning wheel 
was seldom idle. 

With experienced hands and 
a practiced foot, the treadle 
operated spinning wheel help-
ed clothe the early pioneers. 
As each long thread was spun 
out, the wheel buzzed gently 
at first, then whirred louder 
and louder and louder until 
the spinner brought it to an 
abrubt halt. This was hardly 
the cheeriest sound in the 
world, especially at night. 
When Huckleberry Finn near-
ed the Phelps' cabin, he ". 
heard the dim hum of a spinn-
ing-wheel wailing up along 
and sinking along down again; 
and then I knowed for certain 
I wished I was dead - for that 
is the lonesomest sound in the 
whole world." 

As time went on, farmers, 
especially in the East, came to 
adopt some of the dress of 
their urban cousins. But even 
though they might dress up in 
"boughten" clothes for Sun-
day, most of the early farm 
folk still wore everyday cloth-
ing designed more for utility 
than fashion. 

SOUTH OF SQUARE IF YOU... 
CASTRO COUNTY 

LUCKY 7 CB CLUB 
14-16-1tc 

I••••••••••••••••••••I 
FOR SALE-1972 Chevrolet 
Super Deluxe Custom half-ton 
pickup. Long wide, clean, load 
ed. Call 647-5657. 	6-13-tfc 

WINDSHIELDS: We've got L-
0-F, Carlite, Pittsburgh, instal-
led right and weathertight. 
TRACTOR GLASS for any size 
cab. And for safety's sake, use 
our SONIC steel-belted radial 
tires. See Gene at Dimmitt Up-
holstery & Garage, 214 N. 
Broadway, 647-2534. 	6-17-tfc 

Office: 647-3274 
Bob Lindsey: 647-5521 
Cobb Adams: 647-2401 
Edd Wilson: 647-4345 

BABYSITTING wanted. Phone 
Jamee at 647-2204. 	8-15-3tp 

PORTABLE DISC Rolling. Ev-
erett Lumpkin. Call 647-2579, 
Dimmitt, Texas. 	8-18-52tc 
••••••••••e,•••••••••• 

The very first settlers wore 
clothing that was homemade 
and coarse, though service-
able. It was made of the skins 
of wild animals, mainly deer 
and bear. The men wore 
breeches and jackets, and the 
women, jackets and skirts of 
enduring buckskin. 

Many farmers also wore 
leather aprons which reached 
below the knees and covered 
most of the chest. Knee 
britches were worn instead of 
long trousers: they were fast-
ened at the knee with a buck-
le. Leather leggings and moc-
casins completed the apparel. 
Hats, if any. were of beaver 
skin in winter and rye straw in 
summer. 

P••••••••••••••••••••I 

Would like to have your Real 
Estate transactions conducted 
in a fast, confidential and 
efficient manner, please give 
us an opportunity to discuss 
your trades, sales or exchanges 
with us. 

3-FOR SALE, MISC. 

L. C. LEE .••••••••••••••••••••• 
WELDING SUPPLIES - Oxy-
gen acetylene welding rod-gog-' 
gles. Dimmitt Consumers. 

3-28-tfc 

In the early 1700's leather 
began to give way to gar-
ments of tow (a coarse mater-
ial made from the short fibers 
of the flax plant), wool and 
linen (also from flax, but the 
longer, softer fibers). As soon 
as the sheep population of the 
settlers had increased and flax 
was grown more generally, 
leather clothes were replaced 
by homespun garments of 
wool and linen. Men wore 
breeches and jackets of tow, 
coarse linen or linsey-woolsey, 
which had a warp of flax and a 
woof of wool. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to express our 

appreciation to the Walter 
Schillings, Roger Schillings, 
Danny Schillings, Randy Schill-
ings, the Hugo Byers, the A. P. 
Eppersons, Rev. Mike Good-
win, Larry Morris, Jerry Mor-
ris, Dan Bruton, the Trent 
Downings and Kippie, Donna 
and Wayne Meacham for mov-
ing us while Roy was in the 
hospital with pneumonia. It's 
nice to know people like you. 
Thanks again. 

THE ROY MEACHAMS 
14-16-1tp 

FOR SALE: 1973 Suzuki 400, 
Phone 647-3514 or 647-3164. 

6-6-tfc 

REAL ESTATE 
719 West Lee Street 

806-647-2244 

Dimmitt, Texas 79027 1964 PICKUP for sale or trade. 
Chevy with SWB, slick body. 
Will trade for later model 
pickup or tractor. with-post-hole 
Etigg4a- Call 647-2477. 	6-7-tfc 
1••••••••••••••••••••1 

Now leather, when dry, did 
provide a fair insulation. But 
when it was wet, it was the 

9-HELP WANTED 
••••••••••••••••••••• 
MAID WANTED at Colonial 
Inn Motel. 	 9-1-tfc 

WANTED: Bookkeeper-Typist. 
Write Box 67, Dimmitt, Texas 
79027. 	 9-14-tfc 

OFFICE HELP WANTED: 
Switchboard and admissions. 
Apply at Plains Memorial Hos-
pital between 8 a.m. and 5 
P•m • 	 9-15-tfc 

L.V.N. NEEDED for 3-to-11 
shift. Apply in person to Joyce 
Adrian at South Hills Manor 
nursing home, 647-3117. 

9-6-tfc 
1••••••••••••••••••••4 

THREE BEDROOM house for 
sale, with 1 '4 baths and ga- 
rage. Good price. Call 647- 
2428. 	 1-10-tfc 

Farm women wore short 
gowns and petticoats made of 
linsey-woolsey in summer and 
wool in winter. They covered 
their heads with hoods, 
shawls or sunbonnets. With 
the possible exception of her 

HAMMOND M-3 organ with 
Leslie 145. Percussion and 
drawbars. 647-5462. 	3-9-tfc 

FOR ECONOMICAL Storage 
and Filing, see our PERMA-
FILE STORAGE BOXES AND 
PERMA-DRAWERS. Letter 
size Perma-Drawers only $9.00. 
Castro County News, 108 W. 
Bedford, Phone 647-3123. 

3-19-tfc 

••••••••••••••••••0•• Bond sales total $2,810 in November 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of R. E. Catoe 

would like to express their sin-
cere appreciation to those who 
contacted or helped us when 
our beloved husband, Daddy 
and Papaw passed away. The 
food, flowers, cards and con-
tributions were a token of love 
toward him and his family. 

A special thanks to the Plains 
Memorial Hospital staff and 
Dr. Murphy who went a step 
further than required of them 
by loving and understanding 
him. 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

BY OWNER. All brick three 
bedroom, 1 '4 bath, fireplace, 
fully carpeted, double garage. 
Call 647-4267. 	1-14-tfc 

BY OWNER: Three-bedroom 
home for sale. 1 '4 baths, fire-
place, central heat, carpeted, 
fenced. For appointment, call 
James Horton between 8 and 5 
at 647-2111. 	 1-22-tfc 
t••••••••••••••••••••• 

10-WANTED, MISC. 
••••••••••••••••••••• 

AVON 
Start off the new year with 
excellent earnings. Sell world 
famous cosmetics, quality fam-
ily needs, popular fragrances. 
Call today: Fern Wester, 806-
364-5169 after 6 p.m. 

7-16-Re 

REPOSSESSED refrigerators, 
excellent condition, with ice 
makers. Call Danny at 647- 
3180. 	 3-8-tfc 

D••••••••••••••••••••o 

The News has been authoriz-
ed to announce the candidacies 
of the following persons for the 
offices indicated, subject to the 
action of the May 1 Democratic 
Primary Election: 

7-BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES November sales of Series E totaled $220,550,066 for 94% of 

and H United States Savings the yearly sales goal of $234.3 
Bonds amounting to $2,810 in million. 
Castro County were reported 
this week by County Bond 
Chairman Robert McLean. THE U.S. POSTAL Service 
Sales for the 11-month period was devised by Benjamin 
totaled $51,767 for 86% of the Franklin for the primary pur- 
1975 sales goal of $60,000. 	pose of distributing ideas in a 

Sales in Texas during the free society. It was never in-
month amounted to $18,748,- tended to make a profit, or 
4i9, while year-to-date sales even to meet its expenses. 

,••••••••••••••••••••• 
WANTED: Good used furni- 
ture. Pat's Electric. 647-4421, 
214 E. Bedford. 	10-43-tfc 

WANT TO RENT: 2 or 3 
bedroom house. Call Bill at 
647-3476. 	 10-15-tfc 

C.B. RADIOS-Pace and Hy-
Gain as low as $118.50. Mighty 
T with trunk-m amt antenna. 
8127.50. White's Auto, Dim- 
mitt. 	 3-8-tfc 

••••••••••••••••••••• FOR COUNTY SHERIFF: 
TOM FINLEY 
GRANVILLE MARTIN 

FOR COUNTY ATTORNEY: 
ROBERT BUNTYN 

(Re-election) 

8-SERVICES WILL TRADE 1970 Encyclo-
paedia Britannica, in top con-
dition, for used World Book 
Encyclopedia. Call 647-2400 af-
ter 5 plm. 	 10-6-tfx 

The Castro County News 
2-FOR RENT 

God bless you all. 
MRS. R. E. CATOE 

Mr. & Mrs. Richard Catoe 
Marty Catoe 

Mr. & Mrs. Ron Lohr & Family 
Mr. & Mrs. Paul Catoe 

& Family 
Mr. and Mrs. Alex Catoe 

& Family 
Shelly Cross 

Jerry Cox 
14-16-1tp 

647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 

0•••••••••••••••••••01 
FENCES-all types 'installed. 
QUALITY construction; financ-
ing available. Free estimates. 
Contact Gene Sanders, 647- 
2477. 	 8-42-tfc 

••••••••••••••••••••• 

o••••••••••••••••••••1 
ANDREWS TRAILER PARK: 
Trailer space for rent. FHA ap-
proved. Paved streets. Tele-
phone and TV cable available. 
Water furnished. New and 
used trailers for sale, most any 
make. Bert Andrews, 647-2478. 

2-7-tfc 

11-LIVESTOCK, PETS 

FOR SALE: 16-inch well cas-
ing, new steel, 18'72 cents per 
pound; 6 and 8-inch column 
pipe. Highest prices for junk 
iron. Farwell Pipe & Iron, Ph. 
481-3287, 601 Ave. A, Farwell 
Tx. 	 3-6-tfc 

Published each Thursday in Dimmitt, Texas; by the News Pub-
lishing Co., 108 W. Bedford. Second Class Postage Paid at Dimmitt, 
Texas. 

FOR 
COUNTY COMMISSIONER: 

Precinct 1: 
GEORGE E. BENNETT 

(Re-election) 
Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press Assoc-

iation, Panhandle Press Association and National Newspaper Assoc. 

•••• ••••••••• ••••••••4 

FOR SALE: Crossbred and Du-
roc Gilts, Registered Hamp-
shire boar. Robert Duke, Ph. 
846-2230. 	 11-7-tfc 

WILL SKIRT and tie down all 
mobile homes. Also will repair 
any damage or problems you 
have. 647-5462. 	8-9-tfc 

WILL DO WELDING, evenings 
and weekends. Call Kenneth 
Oldham, Shop, 647-2667 or 
Home, 647-5489. 	8-2-tfc 

M&M RADIATOR & Salvage: 
Clean and repair, new and used 
radiators. Will buy junk iron, 
batteries and cars. 507 SW 4th. 

8-16-tfc 

Six Months $3.50 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

One Year. 55.00 	School Year, $4.00 

COUNTRY ARMS APART-
MENTS: One, two and three 
bedroom apartments, built-in 
stove and refrigerator. Call 
G47-3318. 	 2-44-tfc 

1972 CASTLE trailer, 14 x 55', 
two refrigerated air condition-
ers. Bert Andrews, 647-2478. 

3-14-tfc 
Precinct 3: 
JIMMIE HOWELL 

(Re-elction) 

11••••••••••••••••••••I 

15-LEGAL NOTICES 
WANTED: Weaner pigs and 
feeder shoats. C. R. McGhee, 
Hereford, 364-1045. 	11-48-tfc 

NOW OPEN for business -
Chanters Poodle Grooming sa-
lon, Frankie and Betty Barrett, 
call Hereford 364-2048, 210 
West 5th 	 11-36-tfc 
I••••••••••••••••••••• 

13-LOST & FOUND 

10X60 trailer, in Bert Andrews 
Trailer Park. 647-2478. 3-9-tfc 

FOR SALE: Three repossessed 
TVs: 2 stereos; 1 8-foot pool 
table. Call Lenore at 647-3180. 

3-8-tfc 

FOR RENT: Kitchenette apart-
ments. Bills paid. Cable TV. 
Weekly or monthly rates. 647-
3464. 2-38-tfc 
INDUSTRIAL BUILDING for 
rent. 76 ft. x 26 ft. South 
llighway 385. F. Latimer, 647-i 
4438. 	 2-44-tfc 

General News, City and County 	  

FOR TAX 
ASSESSOR-COLLECTOR: 

KENT BIRDWELL 
(Re-election) 

(Political Advertisement Paid 
For by the Candidates) 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	  Tuesday Noon, 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 	Monday, 10 A.M. 
Sports, Society, Church News   Monday Noon 
Community Correspondence 	 Monday Noon 
Personal Items 	  Monday, 5 P.M. 

Tuesday Noon 

.••••••••••••••••••••• 
NOTICE 

The undersigned hereby 
gives notice of application to 
the Texas Alcoholic Beverage 
Commission, Austin, Texas, for 
a Package Store Permit and a 
Beer Retailer's Off- Premises 
License, to be located at 802 
East Bedford, County of Cas-
tro, Texas. Said business to be 
operated under the name of 
Joe's Liquor Store. Hearing set 
for January 23, 1976 at 9 a.m. 

Jose Ortiz, Jr., Owner 
15-15-2tc 

)••••••••••••••••••••Il 

SPINET PIANO. Must relocate. 
Small monthly payments may 
be arranged for individual with 
good credit. Write Credit Man-
ager, Box 3068, Lubbock, Tx 
79410. 	 3-16-2tc 

•••••.•••••••••••••••I 

DEEPENING WELLS. Spudder 
rig work. Melvin Wethington, 
945-2672. 	 8-16-tfc 
FARM DIRT WORK: Tailwater 
pits dug and cleaned. I am now 
operating out of my home. 
Please call 945-2255 between 8 
and 10 p.m. Bill Mumme, 
Mumme Excavating. 	8-15-tfc 

3-FOR SALE, MISC. STRAYED: One red Durham 
cow. Last seen north of Naza- 
reth. 945-2675. 	13-16-2tc 

10011•••••••••••••••••4 
••••••••••••••••••••• 
MOBILE HOME. Call 995-3460 
in Tulia. 	 3-14-3tc 4- HOUSEHOLD GOODS New 

Homes! 
r- ••••••••••••••••••••• 

WE ARE NOW an authorized 
dealer for JENN-AIR cooking 
units. Kittrell Electronics, .647- 
2197. 	 4-2-tfc 647.3123 For Printing 

LOVE, HATE, FEAR, ANGER, AND 
OTHER LIVELY EMOTIONS BEST 
SELLER BY CALLWOOD $2 00 BY 
MAIL AND RECEIVE FREE CATA-
LOG OF BOOKS ON ASTROLOGY, 
DREAMS. SELF-REALIZATION. 
PROSPERITY. INSPIRATION. MET. 
APHYSICS, ESP. PSYCHISM. MIND 
POWER, HEALING. UFO'S. AND 
PURPOSE 

ATTENTION: 
SALES MANAGEMENT 

TRAINEES 
UP TO $800/MONTH 

KIRBY VACUUM cleaners, re-
built to look and run like new. 
Full one-year guarantee. Kitt-
rell Electronics, 647-2197. 

4-27-tfc 

Everybody's Got 

DIRT! 
We'll Move It! 

• Dozer 

•Maintainer 

•Scraper 

HAWKINS & SON 
DIRT MOVERS 

938-2206 	Hart 

THE JUNIPER TREE 
80X 5045, PASADENA. TEX 77503 

FOR SALE: Odyssey 2000 TV 
game and used color TV. 647- 
5416 after 6 p.m. 	4-16-2tp 

DRAG LINE SERVICE 
PIT CLEANING 

CALL 

CLIFF JOHNSON 
Hereford, 364-2111 

8-44-tfc 
FOR SALE: Whirlpool portable' 
dishwasher, like new. Ph. 647- 
5625. 	 4-16-tfc TRUCK SEATS 

We still have a brick-veneer home now ready for your 
inspection. It has three bedrooms, double garage, built-in 
kitchen, refrigerated air and two baths. 

This modern new home is located south of FM 3215 (Hwy. 
86-385 bypass), in Dimmitt's newest residential area, next to 
the Ruskin Circle Swim Club and Apartments. EXCHANGED .  

15 MINUTE SERVICE 

An 18-year-old nation-
al company needs local 
representatives to work in 
Dimmitt and surrounding 
areas. 

This position has unlim-
ited earning possibilities 
with an opportunity for fast 
advancement. If selected, 

you will be paid up to $200 
per week salary while in 
training with a guarantee 
against commissions upon 
completion of field train-

ing. 
This is not an insurance 

company position and no 
investment is required. 

We have all fringe bene-
fits including a company-
paid pension and profit-
shaifrinygou enplan. 

joy meeting 
people and enjoy making 
an above average income, 
do not miss this oppor-
tunity. For an interview 
appointment, contact in 

person the Texas Employ-
ment Commission, Labor 
Camp, Bldg. 14, East 
Jones, in Dimmitt, January 
25-28. Interviews will be 
held January 28 only. 

NOW 
UNDER CONSTRUCTION 

POWELL'S 
UPHOLSTERY 

Charles Powell, Owner 
601 HALL AVE 
PHONE 385-4555 

LITTLEFIELD, TEXAS 
79339 

If you are dissatisfied in 
your current job: feel ''un-
deremployed' and want a 

chance to show what you 
can really do, call me. I am 
interested in speaking with 
honest. mature and mar-
ried persons over 21 who 
are not making at least 
$250 a week. Call: W. 0. 
Davis at 293-4181 after 6 
p.m., January 25-29 only. 

9-16-1tp Watkins Quality Products 

George Construction Co.  
2 homes under construc-
tion in Parkway Addition, 
S. Highway 385: 
1600 Square Feet, cathe- 
dral 	ceiling, 	fireplace, 
bookshelves, central heat 
and air conditioning, bay 
window in dining room. 3 
bedrooms, bath and 3/4 . 
$37.500 
1400 Square Feet, 3 bed-
rooms. bath and 3/4 , fire-
place $33,000. 
Call 647-4469 after 5 and 
weekends. 

Bobcat $65, Coyote $16, 
Gray fox $19 

Fur Buyer will be in Dim-
mitt at Von's Cafe each 
Saturday from 1:45 P.M. to 
2:15 P.M. beginning Jan-
uary 24th. Skin case all fur, 
not open up the middle. 

Northwestern Fur Co. 
Colorado City, Texas 

We have started construction on several new homes, ranging 
in size from 1,200 sq. ft. to 2,200 sq. ft. These new homes are 
located in the Latham Addition just west of the Bobcat football 
stadium, and on the Ruskin Circle Drive. We have a MIGHTY GOOD special on VITAMINS till 

FEB. 10. S1 per bottle off regular price, but join 
WATKINS VITAMIN CLUB and get another $1 off, or 
S2 total off. Call for prices and other information. 
Come on out to NOBLE'S COUNTRY STORE and pick 
up other quality products at 25% to 30°. off regular 
price. 

95% Conventional Financing Available 
GOLDEN SPREAD REAL ESTATE 
808 S.W. 2nd 	Tulia, Texas 
Phone 995-4877 	Nile 995-3279 

Good Land On North Plains 

With Plenty Of Water. 

We Have Buyers For Land 

In This Area And Need Your Listings. 

iiierice 
CALL NOW 

E. A. (Doc) Noble Justice Real Estate 
PH. 647-2222 647.2159 or 647.5512 DIMMITT, TX. 



Henry Block has 
17 reasons why 

you should come 
to us for income 

tax help. 

Reason 1. We are income tax 
specialists. We ask the right 
Questions. We dig for every 
honest deduction We want to 
leave no stone unturned to 
make sure you pay the 
smallest legitimate tax. 

647-4177 

H&R BLOCK 
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

116 W Bedford 

Thurs., Fri. & Sat. 
3 Big Days  SEE WILLY THE WHALE DOWN TOWN 

DIMMITT 

BELIEVE H 
GIGANTIC 37 FT. LONG 16 TON SPERM WHALE 

Willy is a 16-ton, 37-foot sperm Whale! He has a tail that measures 11-feet across . . . a 
heart that weighs 60-lbs. and 42 teeth of PURE Ivory! Willy's total weight is 32,458 lbs. 
Truly a great mammal captured and killed in the North Pacific Ocean by Japanese 
fishermen. 
(Special rates to children's organizations such as Boy Scouts, Girl Scouts, 4-H, etc. when 
they are in groups with leaders.) 

9:00 a.m. — 6:00 p.m. Daily 
Thurs., Fri. & Sat. — Jan. 22, 23 & 24 

BAIIKAMERICARO 
FOOTED SLEEPERS 

Super soft interlock knit 2-pc. sleeper. Non-

skid plastic dot soles, gripper fasteners. 

Flame retardant, Color fast. Shrink resistant. 

Blue, Maize, or Aqua in sizes 0,1,2,3,4. master chargu 
—„. 
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'.`*f.•jooi--' Big Thirsty 

BATH TOWELS 

Reg. $2" - $399  

Now Only 
WOMEN'S COLORFUL CRINKLE 
PATENT SOFTEE OXFORD 

Reg. 3.99 

$026 
Afa ea. 

OR 3 PRS. FOR $676  

$1 96  ea. 

OR 3 FOR $500  

Men's Hooded Thermal 
Irregulars 
Reg. $1" 	1 I 

- 29C 

A real bargain—the moment you slip them on you'll feel the 

flexible softness of this potent shoe with o crepe sole and heel.  

Colors: Black, White, Red, Navy, Bone. Sizes 5 to 10. 

ea. 
SWEAT 
SHIRTS 
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Silver Saver 
.,j3ESTFORM, 
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; 	
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r  ras 1, 10 
1 

Reg. $699  
Zip Front 

Thurs., Fri. 

& Sat. Only 	• 

Have 

A -Whale-Of- 
A-Good-Time LADIES 

. PANTS Boys' No-Iron 
Select Group 	Values to prs. 

for OR 3 FOR $1000  

Reg $5 

376 

=6809
)
11 

1%. JEANS $499  
2 for $7 It' 

i; 	a 

3 for $10 

Be o winner with these specials----o great buy to help 

round out your wardrobe. Double knit polyester ponts in 

o wide variety of solids, jacquards, checks and novelty 

notterns in lots and lots of colors. Sizes 10-20. $259  each... 2 for 
Don't Miss This Or You 

Will Miss Part Of Your Life 

Ladies & Juniors 

KNIT 
TOPS 
Select Group 

Values to $6' 
Now Only SEAMLESS FIBERFILL BRA 

Attention ladies „ . this is the Bestform fantastic bra 
with the ultra smooth seamless cup of light fiberfill 
podding. Lycra stretch bond bottom back and sides 
Adiustoble stretch strops. Sizes A 3236, B 32-38, 
C 34-38. White. 

WE KEEP PRICES DOWN!! 

Men's Kahki No-Iron 

PANTS & 
SHIRTS 
$476 

ea. 

OR 3 FOR $1200  
No Special Offer 

In Stock Prices Only 

$926 

ea.  

co BOBCATS 
& BOBBIES! 

Bring A Friend And 

Share The Fun 

State Farm 
is still the best 
car insurance 
value in Texas. 
Besides the best in service and 
protection, State Farm has 
fates tor most Texas drivers 
that are 15% less than rates set 
by the State For all the details. 
call or stop by 

Kent Birdwell 
116 E. Jones St. 
Phone 647-3427 

Like a good 
neighbor, 
State Farm 
is there. 

1AP4 M MUTUAL 
r- r , *.';iinANCE COMPANY 
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Nazareth's honor students listed Dimmitt student 
on honor roll 

Ronald Clifford Parker, a 
freshman student from Dimmitt 
at Harding College, Searcy, 
Ark., has been named to the 
Dean's Honor List. 

SON OF Mr. and Mrs. Ron-
nie Parker of Dimmitt, Parker 
is a 1975 graduate of Dimmitt 
High School. He was valedic-
torian of his class, chosen 
"Most Courteous Boy" in the 
school and was student body 
president his senior year. 

To be listed as an honor 
student, a freshman at Harding 
College must have a minimum 
grade average of 3.25 and carry 
at least 12 hours. 

With a record enrollment of 
2,601 students for the fall 
semester, Harding has been 
designated a Bicentennial In-
stitution and has scheduled 
several special events to cele-
brate the nation's 200th birth-
day. 

FIRST GRADE 
"A", Russell Acker. 
"B", Alan Birkenfeld, Clint 

Hoelting, Randy Hochstein, 
Melissa Finley, Charlotte Heck, 
Mario Hartman, Matthew Hat-
la, Wade Drerup, Kenny Kern, 
David Steffens, Shawn Wil-
helm, Kenneth Wilhelm, Pam-
ela Ehly, Leroy Schulte, Chris 
Kleman, Craig Huseman, Phil-
lip Durbin, Patrick Birkenfeld, 
Delia Bermea, Paul Bermea, 
Chad Belyeu, Sheila Acker. 

FOURTH GRADE 
"A", Kevin Acker, Elizabeth 

Albracht, Anne Birkenfeld, 
Francis Kern, Renee Ramaek-
ers, Shari Schilling, John 
Schmucker, Gerry Vercamp. 

"B", Joel Birkenfeld, Philip 
Birkenfeld, Stanley Drerup, 
Sidney Gerber, Cheryl Hoel-
ting, Curtis Hoelting, Bart 
Huseman, Roger Huseman, 
Mark Kleman, Dean Schacher, 
Marvin Schmucker. 

EIGHTH GRADE 
"A", Teresa Brockman, Na-

dine Durbin. 
"B" Leland Hoelting, Di-

anne Hochstein, Dewayne 
Heck, Norman Gerber, Jimmy 
Kern, Lisa Pohlmeier, Robert 
Pohlmeier, Doretta Ramaekers, 
Debbie Schacher, Dale Wil-
helm, Jeffrey Schmucker. 

SEVENTH GRADE 
"A", Laura Kleman, Perry 

Brockman. 
"B", Neal Hoelting, Joe 

Hochstein, Gerry Kleman, Sha-
ron Gerber, Dale Hoelting, 
Rodney Kleman, Dwayne Ack-
er, Chris Hatla, Walter Ver-
kamp, Edith Durbin. 

The honor roll for students in 
Nazareth Public Schools for the 
past six weeks has been an-
nounced by Supt Joe King. 
They are: 

THIRD GRADE 
"A", Mark Kleman, Ken-

neth Kleman, Russell Hoelting, 
Nancy Hatla, Leona Gerber, 
Christopher Gerber, Hector 
Bermea, Richard Backus, Rex 
Acker. 

"B", Chrisalda Bermea, 
Howard Steffens, LaDawn 
Schmucker, Lonny Huseman, 
Billy Huseman, Paul Hartman, 
Kim Drerup, Dorothy Durbin, 
Patsy Birkenfeld, Dwight Ack-
er. 

SIXTH GRADE 
"A", Daniel Acker, Pierce 

Brockman, Karen Huseman, 
Karen Birkenfeld, Roxane Bir-
kenfeld, Brenda Hoelting, Patti 
Schacher, Danelle Schmucker, 
Calvin Schulte, Paul Verkamp, 
Elizabeth Wilhelm. 

"B", Denise Acker, Wayne 
Backus, Brenda Birkenfeld, 
Virgil Huseman, Michael Kern, 
Joe Kleman, Vera Ramaekers, 
Richard Steffens. 

Miss Aleman listed 
on SPC honor roll 

SECOND GRADE 
"A", Dale Albracht, Gail 

Birkenfeld, Ramona Heiman, 
Michael Huseman, Troy Huse-
man, Kelly Schilling, Annette 
Schmucker, Eugenia Shelton. 

"B-, Mary Lou Bermea, 
Darryl Hoelting, Kevin Hoel-
ting, Bruce Huseman, Cecelia 
Kern, Brian Ramaekers, John 
Kleman, Benny Schacher, De 
Zane Schacher, Deborah 
Schmucker, Billy Steffens, The-
resa Wilhelm. 

FIFTH GRADE 
"A", Sharon Birkenfeld, 

Mary Jean Huseman, Jeanie 
Wilhelm, George Hochstein, 
Rhonda Hoelting, Deanna 
Hoelting. 

"B", Tammy Heck, Annette 
Hoelting, Janet Huseman, Al-
ison Durbin, Simona Schacher. 

SENIORS 
"A", Vera Birkenfeld, Bev-

erly Heck, Elaine Schulte, 
Theresa Kern, Wanda Schach-
er. 

"B", Angie Wilhelm, Nor-
man Acker, Deanna Heiman, 
Carol Hochstein, Shirley Maur-
er, Christine Wilhelm. 

JUNIORS 
"A'", Gail Kleman, Dorothy 

Guggemos, Cindy Schacher, 
Judy Steffens. 

"B", Sheryl Schulte, Danny 
Gerber, Rosemary Schulte, 
Theresa Huseman, Jenny 
Huseman, Victor Steffens, 
Tommy Kern, Elaine Acker, 
Kelly Book. 

SOPHOMORES 
"A" Tony Brockman, Chris 

Book, LaDonna Brockman, 
Cheryl Hartman. 

"B", Kenny Brockman, Deb-
bie Schilling, Karleen Kleman, 
Anna Huseman. 

FRESHMEN 
"A-, Patricia Kern, Joyce 

Acker. 
"B", Paula Mauer, Bernard 

Acker, Colleen Gerber, Paige 
Hatla, Stephen Wilhelm, Glen-
da Gerber, Evey Wilhelm, Jim-
my Huseman, Kris Altman, 
Clayton Acker, Germaine Pohl-
meier, Kerry Kleman, Cyrilla 
Brockman, Paul Huseman. 

Estella Aleman, a Dimmitt 
student in South Plains College 
at Levelland, has been named 
to the dean's honor list for the 
fall 1975 semester. 

TO ACHIEVE this listing, a 
student must maintain at least 
a 3.25 grade point average, 
with no failing grades, while 
carrying 12 or more semester 
hours. 

JERRY SCHAEFFER drives 
under for a score-tying basket 
against Morton in the first 
quarter of Friday night's Dis-
trict 3-AA game at Levelland. 
Following his shot are Morton's 
Ricky Lewis 1111 and Kenneth 
Standmire [21), and Dimmitt's 
Jim Birdwell. This basket knot-
ted the score at 8-8, and the 
lead changed hands throughout 
the game until the Indians 
rallied in the fourth quarter for 
a 49-42 victory. 

SQUAREii 
DANCE 
TIPS 

Two v  squares enjoyed th& 
calling of tips by Johnny Gill-
enwater at the first meeting of 
the 1976 square dance year in 
Dimmitt— and what a _year it is 
going to be. 

FIRST is our big Heart Fund 
Dance at the Exhibition Center 
Feb. 7. Plans were made for 
the dance and last-minute de-
tails discussed. 

The public is invited to this 
dance and donations will be 
taken at the door. All proceeds 
will go to the Heart Fund. 

Members of the Heart Fund 
Committee of Dimmitt will help 
the square dancers by being at 
the door for donations, helping 
at the refreshment stand and 
with the door prizes. 

Billy Harman, Gary Cole and 
Bill Harman will be asking local 
merchants for donations for 
door prizes, and Tom Crawford 
will ask for door prizes in Tulia. 

PLEASE COME and square 
dance or watch the fun and 
help this worthy cause. 

We were lucky to have L. L. 
and Mary Wallace at our meet-
ing. They are the Panhandle 
Square Dance Association pres-
idents: our club belongs to the 
PSDA. 

Wallace told us about the 
District III Jamboree Jan. 31, 
and about the possibility of 
Dimmitt, Happy, Friona, Naz-
areth, Canyon and Tulia form-
ing their own district within the 
PSDA. 

The Dimmitt Promenaders 
belong to District IV now and if 
this part of the Panhandle be-
came a district we would be 
either in District I or District V. 

We also had Glenn and Eliz-
abeth Amburn, Fern and Troy 
Mott as visitors. Gary and 
Kathy Cole, presidents of our 
club, served refreshments. 



bounding battle to Dimmitt's 
Danny Vaughan. 

But the Indian defense was 
doing its own miraculous thing, 
too, sagging against all-stater 

Busy weekend 
awaits coach 

dated back to the second Dim-
mitt-Friona game last year. 

WILLIAMS, who usually av-
erages 30 or more points per 
outing, finished with 29—with 
10 of them coming in the fourth 
quarter. He had to take second 
place to Vaughan in rebound-
ing, though, 9-8. 

Schaeffer, playing his best 
game this season, led Dim-
mitt's scoring by sinking 11 
points while keeping Morton's 
guards on edge. Birdwell sank 
9, Vaughan 8, and Keith Crum 
and Brad Glenn 6 each. 

"I THINK a few key mis-
takes at crucial times cost us 
the game, but I was proud of 
the way our kids played," 
Cleveland said. "We outshot 
them from the floor, percent-
age-wise, and we out-rebound- 

ed them—which I didn't ex-
pect. But we made twice as 
many mistakes in ball handling 
as they did (15 turnovers to 
seven), and you just can't do 
that in a game that's that 
close." 

Still, the district race isn't 
over yet—and Morton's coach 
was the first to remind every-
one of that fact. 

The relieved Whillock, whose 
Indians have knocked off Class 
AAAA and AAA teams reg-
ularly all season, commented 
after Friday night's whirlwind 
finish: "We haven't won dis-
trict—we've still got to play 
them again." 

CLEVELAND, meanwhile, is 
waiting for that second chance: 

"I think our kids realize now 
that we can play with them," 
he said. 

Dimmitt junior varsities 
win titles at Littlefield 

forwards—Salinas, Louise Fa-
gan and Dorothy Rivers—scor-
ed nine each. 

Friona was the junior Bob-
bies' victim in the semifinals 
Friday as Dimmitt won a 53-40 
decision. Salinas and Norma 
Sandoval led the scoring with 
21 and 20 respectively. 

DJHS wins three 
against Morton 

Dimmitt's junior varsity 
teams won both the boys' and 
girls' championships in the 
Littlefield JV Tournament Sat-
urday. 

ROCKY RAWLS scored 10 
points to pace Dimmitt to a 
44-41 victory over Littlefield in 
the boys' championship game 
Saturday night. 

Dimmitt gained the finals by 
defeating Idalou 71-52 in the 
first round last Thursday, with 
Eddie Chavers and David Es-
pinoza scoring 18 points each, 
and with a 47-44 victory over 
Lockney in the semifinals Fri-
day, sparked by Espinoza's 15 
points. 

DIMMITT'S jayvee girls de-
feated Frenship 37-33 in the 
championship game Saturday 
night to win the tournament 
trophy. Mimi Salinas sank 18 
points to lead Dimmitt's scor-
ers in the title bout. 

In the first round last Thurs-
day, the Dimmitt girls topped 
Idalou 40-30 as three Bobbie 

Dimmitt's seventh and 
eighth grade teams won three 
out of four games against Mor-
ton Monday night. 

PLAYING at Morton, the 
seventh grade girls won 28-18 
and the eighth grade girls took 
a narrow 28-27 victory. 

In games played here, Dim-
mitt's seventh grade boys won 
by a 28-25 count, while the 
eighth grade boys lost to Mor-
ton in a high-scoring contest, 
48-40. 

This weekend will be a busy 
one for Dimmitt High School 
Coach Kenneth Cleveland. 

SATURDAY night, his Bob-
cats will play an exhibition 
game against the Floydada 
Whirlwinds in the Amarillo 
Civic Center. The game will be 
a prelim to the Missouri Valley 
Conference game between 
West Texas State and Bradley. 

Then on Sunday afternoon, 
Cleveland will be honored in 
Panhandle Sports Hall of Fame 
ceremonies in Amarillo. 

The Hall of Fame program 
will begin at 2 p.m. in Badger 
Gym at Amarillo College. 

CLEVELAND will be honor-
ed for his feat of guiding his 
1974-75 Bobcat cagers to the 
Class AA state championship. 
With no returning starters, he 
put together a team that posted 
a 35-3 record and captured 
Dimmitt's first state title in 
boys' basketball since 1952. 

In addition to being sched-
uled for the public accolade 
Sunday afternoon, Cleveland—
who has won district champion-
ships 10 of his 14 years here—
is in the running for the Hall of 
Fame's "Coach of the Year" 
award. He is one of three state 
championship coaches who are 
to be honored, along with top 
athletes in football, basketball, 
track, baseball, golf and tennis. 

Three new members will be 
inducted into the Panhandle 
Sports Hall of Fame Sunday. 
They are Grady Burson, Darrell 
Royal and Dick Todd. 

Dimmitt has had three in-
ductees into the Panhandle 
Sports Hall of Fame—Lometa 
Odom, Pat Tate Truelove and 
the late John Blaine. 

Jim Birdwell and cutting off the 
passing lanes to him. Although 
he connected on 75% of his 
shots, Birdwell was able to get 
clear for only four field at-
tempts all night. 

Dimmitt gained control after 
the halftime break, storming to 
a 30-26 lead on a jumper by 
Schaeffer with 3:07 remaining 
in the third quarter. But Wil-
liams—who was nursing three 
fouls—led an explosive come-
back that saw the Indians 
regain the momentum and go 
ahead by 34-30 at quarter's 
end. 

MORTON extended its lead 
to 36-30 early in the fourth, but 
the Bobcats reversed the trend 
again and tied the score at 
36-36 on a jumper by Vaughan 
with 4:30 remaining. Mean-
while, Williams picked up his 
fourth foul and things started 

looking brighter for the Bob-
cats. 

With four minutes left, Mor-
ton called time and Coach 
Whillock issued an ultimatum 
to his Indians: Williams was to 
take all the shots from then on; 
his four teammates were to 
concentrate on getting the ball 
to him. 

The ploy worked. Williams 
sparked a rally that put the 
Indians out front by four points 
with 1:30 remaining and knock-
ed the Bobcats off stride. 

WITH STILL a chance to 
close the score, Dimmitt com-
mitted a pair of crucial passing 
errors that enabled the Indians 
to stretch their lead, then the 
Bobcats started fouling in the 
final minute in desperate at-
tempts to get the ball. As a 
result, Morton extended its 
lead to nine points—the widest 
margin of the game—before 
Dimmitt could get back on the 
board. 

When the smoke had clear-
ed, the Indians owned a 49-42 
victory, an 18-5 season record 
and a firm grasp on the first-
half championship. 

The loss snapped a 30-game 
Dimmitt winning streak that 

NOTICE: 
ALL COUNTY AND 
STATE TAXPAYERS 

All State and County Taxes 
are due and payable on or before 

February 1,1976 
Penalty and Interest will be added after that date. 

• 
• 

 
• 
• 

 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

Election Pct. # Certificate Number 
(for Official use only) Your Registration expires March 1, 1976. Mail or deliver application to 

your County Tax Assessor-Collector by January 31, 1976 for voting as 
of March 1, 1976. Thereafter, Registration is effective on 30th day 
after receipt, 

VOTER REGISRATION APPUCATION 	 Application Number 
(for Official use only) 

TYPE OR PRINT IN INK 

If natura ized, 

	

SEX 	court or its 

	

(M/F) 	location: 

    

Month 

 

Day Year 

 

    

Name of County 
If now 
registered 
in another 
Texas 
County 

Social 
Security 
No 

Birth 
Date 

Phone # 	  
Last Residence Address in County 
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• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

C•3 • • 	
• 
• 

Zip City 

• Last Name 
• 
• 
• 
• First name (do not use husband's first name) 
• 
• 
• Middle name 
• 
• 

• • Maiden surname if married woman 

• PERMANENT RESIDENCE ADDRESS: • 
• 
• 
• Street & apt. # or route .::: or location (not P 0 Box) 
• 
• 
• City 	 Zip 
• 
• MAILING ADDRESS IF DIFFERENT FROM ABOVE: 
• 
• 
• Street irP.6.Boi • 
• 
• 
• City 
• 
• 
• State 
• 
• 
• 
••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

	

(City_ 	 or County 	  
Birth 
Place I 	 or Foreign 

	

State 	 Country 	  
I certify that the applicant is 18 years of age or 
over, is a citizen of the United States, has met 
all legal requirements, and holds legal resi-
dence in this county. I understand that the 
giving of false information to procure the reg-
istration of a voter is a felony. 

SIGNATURE OF VOTER/AGENT 

x 
Agent must be a registered voter and must be 
only: (Circle one applicable) 
Husband Wife Mother Father Son Daughter 

Zip 

The disclosure of social security number is 
voluntary only, is solicited by authority of Sec-
tion 45b. Texas Election Code, and will be used 
only by election officials to maintain the accu-
racy and integrity of the registration records. 

TSS-S8300.2 

ARE YOU REGISTERED TO VOTE?—This is the form which can assure you of 
being a registered voter during this presidential election year. If you did not 
receive a form in the mail, you may clip this one, fill it out and mail it to Kent 

Nes  

Birdwell, Castro County Tax Assessor-Collector, County Courthouse, Dimmitt. 
Your registration will become effective 30 days after the tax assessor's office 
receives your application. 

KENT BIRDWELL 
County Tax Assessor-Collector Castro County, Texas 
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The Castro County News Morton wins shootout, 49-42 Bobcats crush 
Ponies, 70-40 

SPORTS 
Dimmitt's Bobcats allowed 

the Olton Mustangs only a 
single point in the first quarter 
en route to a 70-40 district win 
here Tuesday night. 

THE BOBCATS chalked up a 
14-1 lead in the initial period 
and Coach Kenneth Cleveland 
started clearing his bench. 
Dimmitt led by 30-12 at half-
time and by 53-18 after three. 

Jim Birdwell paced Dim-
mitt's scoring with 19, while 
Kevin Workman sank 18 for the 
visitors. 

Hart teams 
down Kress 

MID-AIR CONFRONTATION—Dimmitt's Brad Glenn [5-9] 
harasses Morton's 6.0 guard Loyd Joyce as the Bobcats apply 
their full-court press during the fourth quarter of Friday night's 
District 3-AA shootout at Levelland. This type of sticky defense 
by both teams kept the score low and the game close throughout, 
although Morton emerged with a 49.42 victory. 

Victories were scored by 
Hart boys and girls over Kress 
teams at Hart Tuesday night, 
the Longhorns winning 61-45 
and the girls 50-42. 

With a 4-2 district record, 
Hart is now tied for second 
place in the loop where Vega 
holds undisputed first place. 
The Longhorns are 11-7 for the 
season. 

Two-figure scoring by Bobby 
Allensworth, 16; Kerry George, 
12; and Bryan Irons, 11, push-
ed up the 'Horns margin Tues-
day. It was 10-all when the first 
quarter ended, but the Long-
horns were ahead 28-12 by the 
half and 45-18 at the close of 
the third quarter. 

LaDONNA HART accounted 
for 31 Hart points and Jana 
Mapp came off the bench in the 
second quarter to get 12 crucial 
points for the girls, including 
10 free throws. 

Dana McLain converted from 
forward to guard in the second 
quarter when the team got into 
foul trouble and "did a bang-
up job for us,-  Coach Wes 
Poarch said. 

Scores by quarters were 11-
5, 21-20, 34-30 and 50-42. The 
Hart girls now stand 2-4 in the 
district and 7-10 overall this 
season. 

It was a whale of a game that 
wasn't decided until the last 90 
seconds. But it didn't turn out 
the way Dimmitt's players and 
fans wanted it to. 

MORTON'S Mike Williams 
led a fourth-quarter rally that 
gave the straight-shooting In-
dians a 49-42 victory over 
Dimmitt's Bobcats in the first 
"big shootout" in District 
3-AA. 

More than 3,300 fans filled 
South Plains College's Texan 
Dome in Levelland to witness 
the battle between the region's 
two top-ranked Class AA 
teams. 

The victory made the Indians 
bigger medicine than ever, 
giving Coach Ted Whillock's 
tribe the inside track toward 
the first-half championship in 
district play. 

IT WAS only the first loss of 
the season for Coach Kenneth 
Cleveland's defending state 
champions, but it put their 
backs to the wall. If they're to 
stay in contention, they'll have 
to beat Morton in a Feb. 5 
rematch to force a playoff for 
the 3-AA championship. 

It was a close game from the 
opening tip, controlled by the 
two teams' tremendous de-
fenses. The score was tied 
twice in the first quarter before 
Morton emerged with a 14-12 
advantage. 

The Indians gained a 21-15 
lead midway in the second 
period but the Bobcats fought 
back and closed it to 22-23 at 
halftime as they connected on 
511/2  % of their field shots—
most of them from the outside. 

IT WAS only the second time 
this year that Morton's dyna-
mite offense had been held to 
less than 25 points in the first 
half. The Bobcat defense forced 
a slowdown in the Indian game, 
and on offense Dimmitt's 
guards — paced by Jerry 
Schaeffer—ran the overload at-
tack cooly and deliberately. 
Meanwhile, postman Williams 
—an All-America candidate—
found himself losing the re- 

Freshman girls 
down Morton 60-36 

Cleveland sparks 
7 1-42 Bobbie win 

Dimmitt's freshmen girls 
won their seventh straight 
game and hiked their season 
record to 12-2 Monday night 
with a 60-36 win over Morton. 

NORMA Sandoval led the 
attack with 25 points, followed 
by Brenda Johnson with 12 and 
Julie Hrabal with 10. 

The freshman Bobbies will 
host Kress in a rematch tonight 
(Thursday) at 6:30. Dimmitt 
topped Kress 51-44 last week. 

tuted freely as the Bobbies 
continued to build their lead to 
45-20 by halftime and 57-29 at 
the end of the third quarter. 

647-3123 For Printing 

Beth Cleveland scorched the 
nets for 21 points in the first 
quarter and finished with 37 as 
Dimmitt's Bobbies overwhelm-
ed the Morton Maidens 71-42 
Friday night. 

THE GAME was played in 
the Texan Dome of South 
Plains College in Levelland. 

Aided by Cleveland's nine 
field goals and three charity 
tosses in the first quarter, the 
Bobbies surged to a 29-8 lead 
over the Maidens. The Dimmitt 
girls sank a remarkable 68% of 
their shots in the first period. 

Coach Sam Nichols substi- 

LINDA WISE and Joyce 
Wooten sank 11 'each to help 
the Bobbies earn their third 
straight District 3-AA victory. 

Dimmitt's forwards finished 
with a 51% accuracy mark on 
field goals (30 of 59) and sank 
46% of their free throws (11 of 
24). 

Top-graded guards for Dim-
mitt were Ola Fay McGlaughlin 
and Mel Nelson. 
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KATHY WALES gets above the outstretched hand of Morton's 
Nola Bowley [50] to sink a jumper in the first quarter of the 
Dimmitt-Morton girls' game Friday night at Levelland. This 
basket gave the Bobbies an impressive 27-6 lead, and they went 
on to overpower the Maidens by a 71-42 count to remain 
undefeated in district play. 

Father Stanley among authors 
to be honored at Amarillo 

Rev. Stanley Crocchiola of 
Nazareth is one of the Pan-
handle • authors who will be 
honored at the eighth annual 
Book and Author Dinner to be 
hosted by Friends of the Ama-
rillo Library Feb. 21. 

FATHER Crocchiola, pastor 
of the Holy Family Catholic 
Church at Nazareth, is the 
author of historical and bio-
graphical volumes including 
"The Dalhart Story," "The 
Canadian Story," "The Vega 
Story," "The Lipscomb Story," 
"The Higgins Story," and 
"The Phillips Story." He 
writes under the name of F. 
Stanley. 

Honorees at the dinner, to be 
held in the YWCA Building at 
1006 S. Jackson, Amarillo, will 
be residents and former resi- 

dents of the Panhandle who 
have had books published since 
March 22, 1975. 

SHEILA BICOLL, president 
of the Friends of the Amarillo 
Library, has announced that 
additions to the list of authors 
will be welcomed, since the 
group wishes to invite all eli-
gible writers. 

The guest speaker for the 
dinner will be Alfred D. Stew-
art, associate professor of Eng-
lish at Midwestern University 
of Wichita Falls. His subject 
will be "Science Fiction as 
Literature." 

Reservations may be made to 
Amarillo Public Library, Box 
2171, Amarillo, 79105. The 
$4.50 fee is to be paid at the 
door. 

Finance-investment 
seminar scheduled 

A seminar on finance and in-
vestment will be held in the 
Flame Room of the Pioneer 
Natural Gas building at Here-
ford Saturday, sponsored by 
the Deaf Smith-Castro Counties 
Legal Secretaries Association. 

MILDRED Sheffy, chairman 
of the education committee 
which will direct the seminar, 
announces that it is open to 
interested persons, with a $3 
door fee for registrants other 
than LSA members. 

Registration will begin at 1 
p.m. and participants will be 
welcomed at 1:15 by Barbara 
Wheat, president of the spon-
soring chapter, and Mack 
Tubb, president of the Here-
ford Bar Association. Mrs. 
Sheffy will preside for the pro- 

What's cooking 
at the schools 

Here are the school lunch 
menus for the Dimmitt schools 
for Jan. 26-30. 

MONDAY — Spaghetti and 
ground beef, blackeyed peas, 
sweet potatoes, fruit, rolls, 
butter, milk. 

TUESDAY — Hamburger, 
cheese slices, pork and beans, 
banana cake, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Meat loaf, 
creamed potatoes, green 
beans, pudding, rolls, butter, 
milk. 

THURSDAY — Chicken pot 
pie, cabbage salad, gelatin, 
orange juice, milk. 

FRIDAY — Burritos. corn, 
salad, fruit, milk. 

Photography by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

WEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS, TEXAS 

Box 484 	Phone 684-2535 

gram. 
VIRGIL SLENTZ, a partner 

in Property Enterprises of 
Hereford, will give the keynote 
address. Discussion of "Sav-
ings and Loan Investments and 
the Individual Retirement Act'' 
is scheduled at 2 p.m. by 
Dwight Turner of Security Sav-
ings & Loan, Hereford. 

After a coffee break, John 
Tole of the firm of Schneider. 
Bernet and Hickman of Tulia, 
will speak on "Stocks, Bonds, 
Futures." 

A social hour at 104 Aspen in 
Hereford will begin at 4:30 
p.m., the final event of the 
day's program. 

Kiwanians hear 
singer Monday 

Songs by Patsy Morris, who 
played her own guitar accom-
paniment, entertained the Dim-
mitt Kiwanis Club at its lunch 
Monday. She sang popular 
country tunes and humorous 
folk songs. 

THE SOLOIST was introduc-
ed by Carl Bruegel, who said 
Mrs. Morris also sang in the 
Justin Wilson "comedy con-
cert" here Saturday and was 
selected to tour with the Wilson 
company during the week of 
March 8, a tour that will start 
at Houston and include an ap-
pearance in Amarillo. 

Visits to area club events 
were planned, including Kiwa-
nis Night at Amarillo Civic 
Center Saturday when the Dim-
mitt Bobcats will meet Floyd-
ada in a preliminary game and 
West Texas State University 
cagers will contest Bradley Un-
iversity. 

MEMBERS also planned to 
visit the Tulia Kiwanis Club 
Tuesday and the Key Club at 
Dimmitt High School. 

Key Club members Rodney 
Craig and Brad DuLaney were 
welcomed as guests, with Dan 
Vermillion of the Hereford 
Breakfast Kiwanis Club and 
Kenny Paxton. 

GERITOL 
80 Count Tablets 

Head & Shoulders 

SHAMPOO 
$ 13 7 oz. Lotion 

Sale 

gli[OuNT (ENTEP 
In Bearden Shopping Center 	Phone 647-3158 
Store Hours: Mon. thru Fri. 9:00 a.m. to 7:30 p.m. 

Saturday 9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD JAN. 21 THRU 28 

Cudahy Bar S 

BACON 1 07 
12 oz. 	 pkg. 

         

         

         

         

Sally Hansen Finger Nail 

POLISH REMOVER 
Strawberry, Herbal & Regular 

4 oz. 

MILK OF 
MAGNESIA 

Phillips (Chocolate Flavor 
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COLOGNE 
Myisland Moorea or Corfu 
2.5 oz. Retail Value 'V' 

29 

LOOK 

LAVA 
61/2  oz. Hand Soap 

3 	c 
for 97 

GERM 

Reg. $497  $383 
Special 

SAVINGSO  

SPEAKERS 
#CV N41-7004, Convert-
able Wedge, Surface/Re-
cessed Mount Stereo 
Speaker Set, Reg. $11.99, 

$899 

LOO K 
POTTING SOIL 

Smith, 2 lb. bag, 86c value, 
Reg. 43c, Now 

2 bags for 5 9 

ALL WALLETS 
In Stock 

25% off 
Gibson's Already 

Discount Price 

SAVINGS  

VASELINE HERBAL 
BATH BEADS 

99C 

SECRET 
Roll-On Anti Perspirant 

3 oz. 

Reg. '1" 
Now 

Page 7 

OoLlicr,  
1111. 1.13•Of 

TO BIGGER BUYS 
ROSE 
MILK 
SKIN 

CREAM 
(Rose 
Milk 

 

 

 

   

   

Your 

Choice 
8 oz. 

Now 

Reg. $3597  

Sale Price 

In Stock Reduced 

Off Gibson's 
Regular Low Price 

Safe, Non-Aspirin Pain Reliever 

Datril  

DATRIL 
Safe Non Asprin 

Pain Reliever 

100 Count 

Reg. '149  

Now Only 

99 

O.  6R1STOt MYERS 

	 1 

TALmv()..q 

master charge 
T..E 	Ca., BANKAMEMCARO 

welcome 

GIBSON'S 

Borden 

ICE CREAM 
Y2 Gallon Round 

EGGS 
Nest Fresh Large 

Now 75 doz. 
SPECIAL REDUCTION ON MAKE-UP!! 

Gibson's Regular Price 

On Maybelline, Cover Girl & Clairol Make-Up 

25% OFF 
SPECIAL MARK DOWNS 
AND CLEARANCE PRICES 
ON SELECTED JEWLERY 

Ear Rings, Braclets, Necklaces, 

Rings & Many More! 

(Hurry While Selections Good) 

ra 

Type 88 

TIA11010 ce 00004 Ili SY Now 
Only 

COLOR FILM 
$313 

Conair, Remington & Norelco Hair 

BLOW DRYERS 
Values Up To 528" 

Clearance Price 

1799  
Eagle Claw Snelled 

FISH HOOKS 

SPECIAL 
CLEARANCE 

ON OUR 
REMAINING 
STOCK OF 

FISHING LURES 

Pkg. of 6 
Reg. 43' 

Now 3 	89 pkg. for 	c  

87c MACXESIA 

 

ALL CLOCK RADIOS 

ELECTRIC 
BATTERY CHARGER 

CAMERA OUTFIT 

97 

Kodak Tele-Instamatic No. 608 
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Saturday—FLOYDADA, 	Tuesday 
Amarillo Civic Center 	 There  

Support the Bobbies & Bobcats! Attend The Games! 

Jan. 23 	  Floydada, Girls, There 
Jan. 24 	 Floydada, Amarillo Civic Center 
Jan. 27 	  Friona, There 
Jan. 30 	  Littlefield, There 
Feb 3 	 Morton, Texan Dome, Levelland 
Feb 6 	 Olton, There 
Feb 10 	 Leveliand, Here 
Feb 13 	  Friona, Here 
Feb 17 	  Littlefield, Here 

Support the Boosters Who Support Our Schools, Team and Community! 
C. R. Anthony Co. 

La Mantia, Cullum, Collier & Co., Inc. 
Nelson Drilling & Pump Service 

Kenneth Jackson Ditching Service 
Gifford-Hill & Co., Inc. 

Harman's Department Store 
Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet 

Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc. 
Behrends Insurance Agency 

Dimmitt Shell & Western Auto 
Killingsworth Construction Co. 

Farm Bureau Insurance 
Jack Flynt, Agent and Manager 

Andy Alexander 

Don Hargrove, Contractor 

Dimmitt Consumers, Inc. 
Dimmitt TV Cable Co. 
Bruegel & Sons, Inc. 

Dale Fowler Ford, Inc. 
Colonial Inn Restaurant 
Dimmitt Equipment Co. 

Dennis Floral & Gifts 
White Auto Store 

Word Trucking, Inc. 
Kemp Farms 

George's Mobil Station 
Carver Pharmacy 

Hays Implement Co. 
Dimmitt Car Wash 

Castro County Grain Co. 
Parsons Rexall Drug 

Dimmitt Safety Lane 
Arrowhead Drive In 

Riverside Chemical Co. 
Western Ammonia Corp. 

Farmers Supply Co. 
Flagg Fertilizer Co. 

Flagg Grain Co. 
First State Bank 
Clack Fertilizer 

Huckabay Abstract 
C&S Equipment Co. 

Five Point Gin 
Ann's Steak House 

Dimmitt 66, Inc. 
Earl's Garage 

The Golf Pro Shop 

The North Gin 
Gibson's 

Big T Pump Co. 
Seale Florist 
Dairy Queen 
A&H Supply 
W&C Grain 

Cobb's 
Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 

Cowsert Abstract & Title Co. 
Easter Grain, Inc. 

Production Credit Association 
AAA Flying Service 

Floyd's Exxon Station 
Dimmitt Supermarket 

Chem-Tex Farm Supply 



THE vOST EXCITING FILM EVER VADE 
ON MOTORCYCLE SPORT BY BRUCE BROWN 

PRODUCER OFTHE ENDLESS SUMNER. 

SHOWING AT: 

CARLILE THEATRE 
Dimmitt, Texas 

Sun., Jan. 25th At: 
2:00-4:00-7:30-9:30 

Mon., Jan. 26th At: 
8:00 

Adult Ticket $2.50 
Child Ticket $1.25 

254 OFF 
ON ANY SUNDAY 
Pick up your 25C off discount 

Coupon at the following 

Yamaha dealers 

YAMAHA of PLAINVIEW 
201 Interstate 27 
Plainview, Texas 

County officials to study 
key problems at conference 

The 18th annual conference 
of the County Judges and Corn-
missioners of Texas will deal 
with specific issues that are 
today s problems. 

AMBULANCE service, solid 
waste disposal and law en-
forcement are key problem ar-
eas to which the county officials 
will address themselves, points 
out Charles Lawrence, county 
officials program specialist for 
the Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service and general chair-
man for the conference. 

The conference is set for 
Feb. 3-5 at the Ramada Inn in 
College Station, with registra-
tion the first afternoon. 

A discussion on "Agricul-
tural Markets and Policy To-
day" by Dr. Ronald Knutson, 
Extension economist in mar-
keting and policy, will kick off 
the program on Feb. 5. State 
Comptroller Bob Bullock will 
tell about "A New Look at the 
Office of the State Comptrol-
ler." Other speakers will be 
Houston attorney James Green-
wood II, chairman of the Jail 
Standards Commission, who 
will give a current review of the 
commission, and Houston at-
torney Donald L. Howell, who 
will outline steps for setting up 
special districts and authori-
ties. 

IT'S NOT MAGIC„,IT JUST 
ACTS THAT WAY 

You'll think it's magic when you see what the heat pump does. but it's not at all 
It probably will seem quite impossible that one unit can provide clears efficient 
electric heating and cooling with only one unit, one thermostat setting. The important 

thing to remember is the heat pump is today's answer to improving your 
lifestyle—economically and efficiently Sound like magic? Not at all. 

ENERGY EFFICIENCY ALLOWANCE 

We, at Southwestern, are interested in yOUf getting the most 

for your energy dollar That s why we're offering an Energy 
Efficiency insulation allowance to our customers in existio 
Mmes who install electric comfort heating. Ask us about It. 

111.1%11.11,1-‘1 tOES 5O itUlk Son 

et. ~oJVAWFS, 

51h71/1 1 ELECTRIC 
' 44•P PA4 
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Ela SO MAU IEVIPIF 

CALL US FOR A FREE PERSONALIZED HOME HEATING COST SURVEY 

(OuAl. OPPORTUNITY thrOlOtik 

Kyle Broderson of Dimmitt 
was Montana Tech's most im-
proved offensive lineman in 
1975, reports Head Football 
Coach Bill Sprinkle. 

AT 6.2 and 233 pounds, 
"Kyle was bigger and a little 
stronger, and with his fresh-
man year behind him, a better 
player for his experience," 
Sprinkle said. "He had several 
good games and played consis-
tently all season. We'll count 
on him to lead our offensive 
people into battle in 1976.- 

The Tech mentor said Brod-
erson proved to his teammates 
that hard work pays off. 

Broderson, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Emmett Broderson of 
Dimmitt, studies petroleum en-
gineering at Tech. 
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S. Hwy 385 
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TO 
ELECTRIC, 

HEAT 

Morton girls' game at Levelland. The Bobbies 
won the game by a convincing 71-42 score to 
remain undefeated in district play. 

DIMMITT GUARD Ola Fay McGlaughlin 
grabs a rebound as teammate Marla Winders 
[41] breaks upcourt to set up a relay in the 
fourth quarter of Friday night's Dimmitt- Two hundred years ago, the witch hunters would have burned us at the stake 

for even daring to dream of a clean, practical means of heating our homes like 
electric heat. Fortunately, things have changed since then and today you can 

choose a heating system that is not only clean arid efficient, but also economical and 
environmentallysound You don't even have to look for a witch to give you a great 

deal like this one. Call the electric company 	we'll show you how easy it is to 
BESWITCHED to real comfort home heating that's as modern tomorrow as it is today.  

ASK ABOUT THE HEAT PUMP 

Broderson lauded 
by MT grid coach 

SWPS halts 'pass-through' 
of new state assessment 

Southwestern Public Service 
Co. announced this week that it 
will no longer bill its Texas 
customers monthly for the one-
sixth of one percent of its 
annual Texas revenues that is 
is assessed under the law 

which established the Texas 
Public Utilities Commission. 
The company also announced 
that it would refund the amount 
that it has collected since the 
new law went into effect. 

A SOUTHWESTERN spokes-
man said that, while the com-
pany and the Public Utilities 
Commission were in agreement 
that the tax clause in the 
company's rate ordinances 
made the collection of the as-
sessment completely legal in 
urban areas, there was a dif-
ference of opinion between the 
commission and the company 
on whether the tax clause per-
mitted the company to assess 
rural customers. 

"The question here is what 
is fair to Southwestern's cus-
tomers. It would not be fair to 
collect legally from one set of 
customers and not assess the 
others, when all of our Texas 
customers are part of the juris-
diction of the utility commis-
sion," the spokesman said. 

VETERANS' 
SERUICES 

By Bedford Smith 
Veterans Service Officer 

Here's Hart's 
school menu 

HERE ARE the lunch menus 
for Hart Schools for Jan. 26-30. 

MONDAY — Enchilada cas-
serole, tortillas, tossed salad, 
buttered corn, peanut butter 
brownies, milk. 

TUESDAY — Cheeseburger 
on homemade buns, lettuce, 
onion, pickles, baked beans, 
applesauce, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Fried fish, 
tartar sauce, cornbread, black-
eyed peas, cabbage salad, or-
ange cake, milk.  

THURSDAY — Baked ham, 
hot rolls, candied yams, green 
beans, apple rings, butter, 
milk. 

FRIDAY — Chicken pot pie, 
scalloped potatoes, green sal-
ad, crackers, fruit cup, butter, 
milk. 
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PLAIN TALK ON r( 
CAPRICE is the top of the CHEV-
ROLET line. CAPRICE is such a 
wonderful car, it would be the top 
of any car line. In plain fact, WHY 
PAY MORE FOR NO MORE 
CAR? 

• • • • 
HERE'S WHY 

CAPRICE 
IS THE BUY! 

CHEVROLET 

The following News Release 
is of importance to Veterans 
holding GI Insurance Policies 
and their dependents: 

The Veterans Administration 
reminds five million veterans 
covered under its government 
life insurance program to make 
certain that beneficiaries on 
their GI insurance policies are 
current. 

THE VA is obligated by law 
to pay insurance proceeds to 
the beneficiary of record. Most 
of the agency's insured are 
World War II veterans who 
carry National Service Life In-
surance. 

The problem of insurance 
benefits going to an unintended 
recipient generally arises 
where the veteran simply fails 
to change his beneficiary. 

In a typical case, a veteran 
named his mother as benefi-
ciary when he obtained his 
policy. Later the veteran marri-
ed and overlooked the require-
ment to notify the VA of 
intended change in beneficiary. 
Unwarranted financial hardship 
often results. 

IF IN DOUBT as to current 
designation, veterans are urged 
to submit a change of benefi-
ciary. Coker also emphasized 
that lump sum payments only 
may be paid when so designat-
ed by the insured veteran. 

Policy changes should be 
sent to the VA insurance center 
— in Philadelphia or St. Paul, 
Minn. — where the insured's 
premiums are paid. All re-
quests should include policy 
number along with full name 
and address. 

Application forms regarding 
government life insurance 
changes or for filing insurance 
claims are available in our 
office in the courthouse. 
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ruined by 
wild cane 
or sandbur? 
Get Eradicmgeg Caprice Classic Coupe 

CAPRICE is such a 
solid automobile, 
it's value holds up 
and gives you that 
great feeling come 
trade-in time. Tru-
ly, the 1976 CAP-
RICE is an invest-
ment worth mak-
ing. 

Plain talk is all you 
need to convince 
anyone of the ulti-
mate worth of the 
1976 CAPRICE. 
WHY PAY MORE 
FOR NO MORE 
CAR? As your plain 
talk dealer, we want 
to show you why it 
must be CAPRICE 
before any other 
make. 

How can you settle 
for less than en-
joyable car com-
fort, when there's 
CAPRICE? They 
call it CLASSIC be-
cause every engi-
neering refine-
ment possible is 
built right in. The 
result is the 
smoothest, most 
lururious ride ever! 

If your cornfields have been a jungle of wild cane or sandbur, 
you need help. The best help is Eradicane herbicide 
applied in your center-pivot irrigation system. How do you do it? 
With Herbigation" weed control service. It's simple 
enough. You meter Eradicane into your center-pivot 
irrigation line from a supply tank. Water does the work of 
application, either just before or just after corn planting. 

Eradicane controls wild cane and sandbur and many other 
weeds as the weeds sprout. 

That's Herbigation weed control service with Eradicane. It 
works so well performance is guaranteed when used as the 
label directs, or Stauffer will replace the Eradicane. Verify 
purchase, leave a check strip and notify Stauffer promptly. 

This season, grow corn not wild cane or sandbur. Use 
Eradicane. Always follow label directions carefully. 
Order Eradicane now. 

Try one for size! 
Try one for value .! 

Stauffer 
Eradicane from 
STAUFFER CHEMICAL COMPANY 
Agricultural Chemical Division 
P.O. Box 1381 
Houston, Texas 77001 

M. C. ADAMS, O.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 364-2255 
Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Monday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:00 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 



TEXAS 
TALK 

By 
Jim Hays 

Telling the truth about 
tumbleweeds seems almost 
unAmerican since all the 
western movies make us feel 
the rolling weed is a natural 
part of Americana. Fact is 
though, when most of those 
western trail drives were 
taking place the nearest 
tumbleweed was about ten 
thousand miles away . . . in 
the heartlands of Russia. It 
was 1874 before the first 
tumbleweed sprouted in this 
country . . . arriving in a 
collection of Ukranian flax 
seed in South Dakota. With 
each plant capable of pro-
ducing a million seeds. it took 
less than twenty years for the 
Russian thistle to infest a 
good portion of North 
America. Although generally 
scorned by ranchers, experts 
say tumbleweed hay contains 
more protein than orchard 
grass or Timothy Hay and 
more minerals than alfalfa. 
Just as you'd suspect, Euell 
Gibbons recommends the 
weed as a delicacy ... saying 
it tastes like ambrosia when 
cooked like spinach. 

HAYS IMPLEMENT CO. 
Your INC Dealer 

Phone 647-2151 

PLUS sporty aluminum 
wheels for only $97 
sticker price on 
Limited Edition Mustang 
(regular sticker price $176) 

Swiftettes win 5-B first half Bobbies defeat Olton 
to win first-half title 

scorers for Nazareth were Nor-
man Acker and Mark Hoelting 
with eight each. 

Heart Association hears 
of C-PR training here Nazareth's Swiftettes socked 

away the first-half champion-
ship of District 5-B Friday night 
with a 48-30 victory over Cotton 
Center. 

COACH Cathy Wilson's 
Swiftettes finished the first half S••• 

More about 

City favor 

of the district race with a per-
fect 6-0 record, and have de-
feated every 5-B opponent by 
at least 17 points. 

Elaine Schulte paved the way 
with 22 points, followed by 
Cheryl Hartman with 18. The 
Swiftettes jumped to a 16-8 
lead in the first quarter and 
stretched it to 34-18 by halftime 
and to 40-26 going into the 
third period. 

In the boys' varsity game, 
Cotton Center scored a 35-29 
victory over the Swifts. Top 

Dimmitt's Bobbies captured 
the first-half championship of 
District 3-AA Tuesday night 
with a decisive 76-36 victory 
over defending champion 01-
ton. 

joined Marla Winders, Mel 
Nelson and Nita Parker in 
shutting down Olton's offense. 
Ola Fay McGlaughlin and 
Brenda Underwood saw a lot of 
action also. 

The victory extended the 
Bobbies' season mark to 19-6. 

really make our starters work, 
and I think our second six could 
beat a lot of teams themselves. 
That depth has been one of our 
big assets this year." 

Senior guard Kerry Brod-
erson was back in action after 
having missed four games, and 

Training in coronary-pulmo-
nary resuscitation for local 
groups was a major topic for 
the Castro County Unit of the 
American Heart Association at 
its recent meeting. 

A'LAN BRADLEY reported 
two C-PR drills have been held 
at the Plains Memorial Hospital 
the past month. Carol Lantz 
plans to contact large firms in 
Dimmitt about C-PR training 
for their employees. 

Plans for the "Square 'em 

Hart splits two 
with Springlake 

Up" dance to benefit the Heart 
Fund were reported by Gary 
Cole. This square dance spon-
sored by the Dimmitt Prom-
enaders will be held Feb. 7 at 
the County Expo Building. 

An annual event, the dance 
is one of the ways funds are 
raised in Castro County for the 
Heart Association. The money 
will be used in this county for 
promoting help for those who 
have heart problems and for 
educating the public on heart 
disease and how to prevent it. 

JOYCE WHITE, Region II 
director, presented plans for 
advertising the need for educa-
tion on heart problems as a 
means of saving lives. Randal 
Craig, vice-president of the 
county unit, presided. 

The next meeting of the 
board of directors will be on 
Feb. 26. 

Fire calls 
The Dimmitt Volunteer Fire 

Dept. responded to three fire 
calls in the past week, all with 
minor damage. 

Friday, 4:30 p.m.— 613 Du-
lin, grass fire in backyard. 

Monday, 3:30 p.m.-703 N. 
Broadway, short in electrical 
switch. 

Tuesday, 8:30 a.m.—Truck 
passing through city, stopped 
at fire station with smoldering 
fire in trailer loaded with alfalfa 
cubes. 

Hart overcame a fourth-
quarter rally by Springlake-
Earth Friday night for a Long-
horn victory, 50-46. 

THE LONGHORNS reached 
3-2 in district play and 10-7 for 
the season. Kerry George was 
high point man in the game 
with 14. 

Hart led 12-10 at the end of 
the first quarter, 29-20 at the 
half and 39-30 after the third 
quarter. 

The girls' game resulted in a 
41-46 loss for Hart, as the girls 
got into foul trouble and 
Springlake-Earth hit a rash of 
free throws in the fourth. 

LaDonna Hart with 19 and 
Mary Lou Mancias with 15 led 
the scoring for Hart. Terri King 
turned in a good defensive 
game, while Sharla Carson and 
Bobbie Washington both play-
ed steady ball. 

Lindsey Field came off the 
bench and racked up 21 for 
Springlake. W&C GRAIN 

GEORGE Washington said, 
while he was President, "The 
name of 'American' must al-
ways exalt the just pride of 
patriotism. The independence 
and liberty you possess are the 
work of joint councils and joint 
efforts, of common dangers, 
sufferings and successes." 

647-2101 

CofC to honor 
past presidents 

409 E. Bedford 

Swiftettes 
lose to S-F 

Nazareth's Swiftettes played 
Class A powerhouse Sanford-
Fritch in an unscheduled game 
Tuesday night and almost pull-
ed off a victory before a pair of 
turnovers in the last minute 
cost them the game, 61-56. 

IT WAS only the third loss of 
the season for the Swiftettes. 
All their losses have been to 
Class A teams. 

"We had a chance to win 
it." Coach Cathy Wilson said. 
'We pulled within three points 

with a minute to go, but a pair 
of turnovers killed us. 

"It was good experience for 
us," she continued. "We need 
to play some close games, and 
they're a real good ball club." 
(The Eagles have been Class A 
regional finalists for the last 
four years.) 

THREE Swiftettes finished in 

double figures. Elaine Schulte 
sank 20, Cheryl Hartman 19 
and Rachelle Pohlmeier 11. 

After a 14-13 first quarter, 
the Eagles pulled ahead by six 
points at halftime, and the 
Swifts were down by 48-38 
going into the fourth. They 
staged a fourth-quarter rally 
that pulled them within shoot-
ing distance at 59-56, but the 
two last-minute turnovers seal-
ed the victory for Sanford-
Fritch. 

IN THE boys' game Tuesday 
night, the Swifts dropped a 
42-41 decision to Dimmitt's 
junior varsity. 

Nazareth led by 10-7 after 
the first quarter, but Dimmitt 
took control in the second and 
third to build a 35-30 lead 
going into the final period. The 
Swifts outscored Dimmitt 11-7 
in the final frame but their rally 
fell a point shy. 

Darrell Huseman scored 15 
for Nazareth, while Eddie 
Chavers and Jim Bradford 
sparked Dimmitt with 13 and 
12. 

Buy now for extra value! At your 	Ford Dealer! 

Beet Growers 
to meet Friday 

The annual meeting of the 
Texas-New Mexico Sugar Beet 
Growers Association will be 
held in Hereford Friday, with a 
business session beginning at 2 
p.m. and the banquet at 7 p.m. 

THE AFTERNOON meeting 
will be in the Hereford Com-
munity Center and the banquet 
in Deaf Smith County Bull 
Barn. An award to the high 
grower will be presented by 
James Witherspoon, executive 
vice president of the associa-
tion. 

Program speakers will be Dr. 
Steve Winter and Dr. Allen 
Wiese, who have done research 
on sugar beets at the South-
western Great Plains Research 
Center at Bushland, and Bob 
Ginn, agricultural manager for 
Holly Sugar Corp. at Hereford. 

THE VICTORY gave Coach 
Sam Nichols' Bobbies a perfect 
4-0 record in district play after 
the first go-round, and assured 
them of at least a playoff for 
the championship. If the Bob-
bies win or tie for first place in 
the second round, they'll be the 
district champions outright. 

Four Bobbies scored in doub-
le figures as the Bobbies estab-
lished their supremacy on the 
home court Tuesday night. 
Beth Cleveland and Joyce 
Wooten sank 18 each, Sandra 
Tischler contributed 16 and 
Kathy Wales scored 10. The 
Dimmitt forwards connected on 
60% of their field shots. 

The Bobbies jumped to an 
18-4 lead in the first quarter 
and were in control by 40-14 at 
halftime. Nichols rotated his 
bench as the Bobbies continued 
to widen the margin throughout 
the second half. 

"OUR SECOND group of for-
wards—Sandra Tischler, Deb-
bie Murdock and Linda Wise—
did a good job for us," Nichols 
commented. "In fact, our en-
tire second six saw a lot of ac-
tion. They're the ones who 

(Continued from Page 11 
borrowed time. The 30-gallon 
garbage can is the standard 
now. If we convert to this 
system instead of requiring our 
residents to buy 30-gallon gar-
bage cans, it would save our 
people a lot of money." 

THE commission asked City 
Attorney Jack Edwards to re-
view the proposed lease-pur-
chase contract with the leasing 
corporation, "with the inten-
tion of converting." 

In other action, the commis-
sion: 

—Saw a presentation by Bas-
il Clubb of Communications 

• Engineering Co. of Amarillo on 
a proposed new radio-alarm 
system for Dimmitt's firemen, 
and requested further informa-
tion from Fire Marshal Guy 
Waldrop at the next meeting; 
and 

—Set Feb. 16 as the date for 
a public hearing on the propos-
ed rezoning of part of the 
Miller Addition to allow con-
struction of multiple-family 
houses. (The proposal drew 
strong opposition at the origi-
nal zoning commission hearing, 
and that commission has re-
commended the city turn down 
the rezoning proposal.) 

Ford Dealer 
'red Edition 

Sale 

Past presidents of the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce since its 
beginning in 1948 will be hon-
ored at the 1976 chamber 
banquet Saturday evening. 

ROBERT RYAN will pay trib-
ute to the work of these men, 
living and dead, who were 
leaders in past programs of the 
chamber. He will introduce 
those present at the banquet. 

The list of past presidents 
begins with A. C. Hays Jr., 
who served in 1948. Others 
were: 

1949 —
1950 —
1951 —
1952 
1953 —
1954 —
1955 —
1956 
1957 —
1958 
1959 
1960 
1961 
1962 

muth 
1963 
1964 
1965 
1966 
1967 
1968 
1969 
1970 
1971 
1972 
1973 
1974 
1975 

Bob McLean 
Joe Cowen 
B. M. Nelson 
H. H. Carlile 
J. W. Benson 
R. E. Hendrix 
T. E. Harrison 
Earl Brock 
Russel Moran 

— Dexter McGaughy 
— W. E. Kirkpatrick 
— Steve Taylor 
— J. R. Brown 
— James E. Wohlge- 

'Based on suggested retail prices of separate options 
compared to special package prices. (Truck shown with 
white sidewalls $40 extra and rear bumper $60 extra.) 

— J. G. Davis 
Allan Webb 

— Jack Miller 
— C. W. Anthony 
— W. F. Bennett 
— Dr. J. D. Blackburn 
— Jimmy Ross 
— Bo Bryant 
— Reeford Burrous 
— David Bechtol 
— Bill Behrends 
— M. J. Reed 
— Bob Caddell 

New sporty 
Limited Edition 
Mustang II 
with 137  

of extra retail value at no extra charge* Limited Edition Mustang II 2+2 

PLANNING ELECTRIC 
IRRIGATION FOR THE 

FIRST TIME 
Limited Edition Mustang It 2-Door 

Includes: all Mustang II standard equipment 
such as 4-speed stick shift, front disc brakes, 
rack and pinion steering, Plus two-tone lower 
body, bodyside stripe, unique seat inserts, 
styled steel wheels, trim rings, brushed aluminum 
panel applique. Quantities are limited. 'Based on manufacturer's suggested retail price. 

(Car shown with white sidewalls $23 extra.) 

Beautiful new Limited Edition New Limited Edition 
Ford Elite Ford Torino $159 

20 
off total retail value, 
based on traditional 
suggested retail 
pricing, of base 
Torino plus 
additional items. Includes: all Torino standard equipment such 

as V-8 engine, automatic transmission, power steering, 
etc., Plus half-vinyl roof, opera windows, Gran Torino seal 
with Concord cloth inserts, accent paint stripe, bodyside 
molding, dual racing mirrors, sport wheel covers, 
special door trim panels, selected matching cloth 

and vinyl interiors. 

off standard Elite 
sticker price 

Includes: Elite standard 
equipment such as vinyl roof, 

(Car shown with 
white sidewalls 

$39 extra.) 
twin opera windows, automatic trans- 

Quantities are limited. mission, power steering and brakes, etc., Plus 
unique wheel covers, special bench seat and trim, 
special door trim panels, selected matching cloth 
and vinyl interiors, but excluding wheel lip moldings, 
door carpet and deluxe steering 
wheel. Quantities are limited. 

(Car shown with white sidewalls $39 extra ) 

Buy now for extra value at your Ford Dealer Limited Edition Sale. 

Dale Fowler Ford, Inc. 
Dimmitt, Texas 

Bred for the big land. 

Back in the corn belt in 
Iowa and Illinois, most 
any good hybrid will do. 

But out here, things 
are different. You need a 
special kind of corn. 
You need Horizon 
Hybrids. They're bred 
for big yields in this big 

land. 

Explorer Special 
Pickups up to 201  

off* 
Major discounts on Limited Edition Explorer Pickups with 
special metallic paints, mag-type wheel covers, unique 
color-keyed interiors and your choice of equipment such as 
power steering, automatic transmission, air conditioning. 
Quantities are limited. 

WE CAN HELP YOU WITH 
A TURN KEY INSTALLATION 

Muleshoe Electric 
Phone 212-3330 

210 E. 3rd ST. - P. 0. BOX 670 

MULLSHOE, TLXAS 79347 

Ronald Ashford 
272-3454 

Ancel Ashford 
272-4629 

FORD 

TEXIS 
FORD DEALERS 

LID 
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23 Channel 
CB Transceiver 

Delu‘e 
KobHe I 'nil! 

$15995  
Synthesized 23 channel 
circuit. Noise eliminator 
circuit. Variable RI' giii» 
control. 

Front-End 
Alignment 

$ 1  08

ny U.S. Any U8 

Mad

e Car, 
Parts Extra Only If Needed — 
Excludes Front-Wheel Drive Cars 

• Complete analysis and alignment correction 
to increase tire mileage and improve 
steering safety. 

• Precision equipment assurance. 

.4- 
Illge-416,  

. •,-io 
tu,`- 

-, .0•0011010 .,.-..„--- -- 1 

PAXTON 
Tire & Service 

Phone 647-4121 	Hwy. 385 South 

$899  
Per Yd. 

Installed with Pad 

100% NYLON 

12 Colors to Choose From 

HOME DECOR QUICK 
INSTALLATION 

CREDIT 
TERMS 
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Rotary Club elects Gibbs 
Dan Nelson and Marvin Roark, 
directors. 

Buyer's market seen 
for farm supplies 

THE NEWEST approach to 
synthetic leather is a "hole-y" 
suede. The 90 percent rayon, 
10 percent polyester fabric is 
perforated, forming patterns of 
diamonds and dots. It has a 
pigskin look and comes in 
several dusty colors, according 
to Beverly Rhoades, clothing 
specialist with the Texas Agri-
cultural Extension Service. 

As far as fuel is concerned, 
the economist notes that diesel 
and gas supplies should be 
ample but that propane and 
natural gas may again be tight 
in supply this winter. Hayenga 
advises producers to try to 
phase out equipment using pro- 

ACROSS from Independence 
Hall in Philadelphia is a hotel 
where Thomas Jefferson stayed 
while attending the Second 
Continental Congress and 
where he wrote the basic draft 
of the Declaration of Indepen-
dence. 

Al Gibbs was elected Friday 
as president of the Dimmitt 
Rotary Club for 1976-77, to take 
office in June. 

HE WILL succeed Bill Hen-
derson as the chief officer of 
the men's service club. 

Other officers elected Friday 
were Bill Dannevik, vice-pres-
ident; Glenn Gripp, secretary; 
Earl Chaney, sergeant at arms; 
and Henderson, Elmer )(outs, 

pane and to "lock in" a source 
of natural gas since curtail-
ments seem probable. 

YIELDS 

U S Government 
Guaranteed 

THERE AIN'T NO WAY—Dimmitt's Jim 
Birdwell finds the shooting to be a sticky 
proposition in the first quarter of Friday 
night's game against Morton in Levelland. 
The hand over Birdwell's arm belongs to the 
Indians' Fouec Grisby. Behind Birdwell, 

Morton's Mike Williams [43] takes a swat at 
the ball, while Dimmitt's Danny Vaughan [44] 
and Morton's Troy Patton [25] get set for a 
rebound. Birdwell was unable to get the shot 
off, but no foul was called. 

Texas bankers will take look at ag finance 

Most items that agricultural 
producers will need in the 
coming year are in abundant 
supply and prices have eased 
somewhat. So an economist for 
the Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service recommends mak-
ing needed purchases or lining 
up needed supplies. The pur-
chases can also be applied to 
this year's expenses to help 
reduce income taxes. 

"COSTS OF farm inputs 
have generally leveled off as 
supplies have increased steadi-
ly in recent months," points 
out Dr. Wayne Hayenga. "Ma-
ny manufacturers and dealers 
are now offering items at more 
attractive prices—at least 
somewhat lower than in the 
past few years." 

Among items with larger in-
ventories are fertilizer, farm 
equipment, pesticides, wire 
and twine, and seed for certain 
crops. 

Fertilizer use was off during 
1975 so supplies are generally 
up and prices have softened, 
notes the economist. However, 
there is some concern about 
natural gas curtailments that 
would affect nitrogen produc-
tion. So, Hayenga advises pur-
chasing needed fertilizer sup-

plies for the coming year as 
soon as possible. 

"Except for big tractors and 
combines, farm machinery 
sales have been off, so pro-
ducers thinking about replacing 
certain equipment might be 
able to find some bargains," 
says Hayenga. "Many dealers 
will be hard-pressed to move 
items due to large inventories, 
so farmers should be able to do 
some bargaining. Some dealers 
may also be offering rebates." 

lyzing and reconciling farm rec-
ords, and preparing cash flow 
projections. 

If your goal is income ... now is 
the time to look at 8% government-
guaranteed bonds. 
How much surplus savings do you have locked up? 
If it's yielding the usual rates .. . you might increase 
your income from that money by 40%, 50% or more! 
If that sounds good to you . . . read our new booklet 
'8 Reasons Why Government-Guaranteed Bonds 
Make Sense Today." 

For your free copy, just call A. G. Edwards or mail 
the coupon. It might yield a lot more than just in-
teresting facts about bonds. 

MH/MR trustees 
will meet today 

Public singing 
slated Sunday 

A.G. Edwards 
Investments Since 1887 

will deal with their legal res-
ponsibilities and expectations. 

Discussions on the role and 
responsibilities of bank exam-
iners will conclude the second 
afternoon session. 

The outlook for key agricul-
tural commodities—livestock, 
cotton and grain—will be ana-
lyzed during the third morning 
of the school. A concluding talk 
will deal with "The Money 
Market and Outlook." 

The special In-Depth Agri-
cultural Credit Workshop will 
begin on the afternoon of Feb. 
11 and will conclude the morn-
ing of Feb. 13. Actual work 
sessions will deal with prepar-
ing financial statements, ana- 

■ ■ ■ 

"Super Sing Sunday" is 
announced by Rev. Jim Hed-
rick, pastor at the Dimmitt 
Church of the Nazarene, who 
invites the public to a song 
service beginning at 10:30 a.m. 
Sunday. 

FEATURED singers will be 
the Keeler Sisters from Clovis, 
N.M. There will be other spec-
ial presentations of gospel mu-
sic, the pastor said. 

Much congregational singing 
is also planned and all who like 
to sing are invited to be present 
and join in the music. 

The board of trustees of the 
Central Plains Comprehensive 
Community Mental Health/ 
Mental Retardation Center will 
meet at 6:30 p.m. today (Thurs-
day) at the Central Plains MH/ 
MR Center on 2601 Dimmitt 
Road at Plainview. 

THE AGENDA announced 
for the meeting includes the 
contract for the Coronade Half-
way House, a projected con-
tract with the Department of 
Public Welfare, TDMHMR site 
visit Feb. 17-19, and reports on 
finances, program and pro-
gress. 

December wrecks 
hike total to 99 

Texas bankers, who have a 
big stake in the future of ag-
riculture in this state, will be 
taking a close look at the future 
of agricultural financing during 
a weeklong program in Feb-
ruary. 

THE 24TH Texas Farm and 
Ranch Credit School for Com-
mercial Bankers, the annual 
meeting of the Agricultural and 
Rural Affairs Section, Texas 
Bankers Association, and an 
Agricultural Credit Workshop 
are expected to attract a large 
number of bankers who will 
delve into the expectations of 
agricultural finance as the third 
100 years of this country gets 
underway. 

All activities are set for Feb. 
9-13 in the Rudder Conference 
Center on the campus of Texas 
A&M University. 

The first day of the general 
session will deal with the 
changing environments relating 
to politics, marketing and fi-
nancing, points out Dr. Wayne 
Hayenga, program chairman 
and economist in management 
for the Texas Agricultural Ex-
tension Service. 

CONCURRENT sessions on 
loans for crops and machinery, 
dairies, cow-calf operations and 
feedlots will hightlight the 
morning program of the second 
day. A special session will also 
be held for bank directors and 

■ ■ 

I am interested in earning a higher interest on my money. 
Please send me your booklet "8 Reasons Why Government-
Guaranteed Bonds Make Sense Today." 

SHOULD YOU HAVE A 
RETIREMENT PLAN?? 

The Texas Highway Patrol 
investigated nine accidents on 
rural highways in Castro Coun-
ty during December, according 
to Sgt. J. R. Smith, Highway 
Patrol supervisor of this area. 

These crashes resulted in six 
persons injured, but none kill-
ed. 

The rural traffic accident 
summary for Castro County 
during 1975 showed a total of 
99 accidents resulting in nine 
persons killed and 42 persons 
injured. 

NAME 	  

ADDRESS 	  

CITY 	  

STATE 	 ZIP 	  

TELEPHONE 	  

Mail to: 

You are not forced to have a plan...but! 

or phone 

BOB HILL 
A.G. EDWARDS & SONS, INC. 
320 SOUTH POLK 
AMARILLO, TEX, 79109 
PHONE M61372.5751 

AN-13-10-ERS-10-1-74 

WE BOUGHT OVER 
2,000 YDS. OF 

HI-LO SHAG 
AT A BIG DISCOUNT 

SO HERE'S YOUR CHANCE TO 
SAVE ON BEAUTIFUL CARPET! 

U.S. Department of Commerce traced 

the economic future of 100 men age 

23. They found the following 

projected results 40 years later, 

at age 65. 

1.. 	 will have $1 0, 000 a year or more as an in zoine 

3 	 will have $5,000 to $10,000 a year. 

7 	 will have $5,000 or less coming in. 

39.. 	   will not have reached age 65 because of death. 

50 	 will be dependent on someone else wholly or in part. 

because: 	A) They didn't have a plan. 

B) They had a plan that failed. 

C) They just didn't start soon enough. 

SHOULD Y'..)1) DELAY START LNG? 

You Can Delay and Lose Compound Interest And Tax Credits. 

Example: 

A man 40 years of age decides he will 

establish a plan to save $1,500 per 

year invested at only 6% interest, 

but if he DCLAYS:* 

3 months 

6 months - 

1 year 
2 years 

- he will have approximately $ 1,611 LESS at retirement. 

he will have approximately $ 3,225 LESS at retirement. 

- he will have approximately $ 6,450 LESS at retirement. 

- he will have approximately $12,510 LESS at retirement. 

*Tax credits not included in above example. 

Compound interesL once lost can never be recaptured!!! 

Establish your Individual Retirement Account or Keough Plan (HR-10) today 

Contributions CAN BE MADE monthly, quarterly, semi-annully, or annully thru 
+•••10••••••• 

FIRST STATE BANK 
319 N. BROADWAY 	"THE FINEST IN FURNITURE, CARPET & DRAPERIES" DIMMITT Of Dimmitt 
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Oimmitt Business and Industrial Review 
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Dimmitt • 'John Deere Night' Monday 

• dinner  	a• • to include 	and rum 
"Farming Frontiers '76", a film program devoted to the 
business of farming, will be presented Monday night at the 
Castro County Exposition Building, beginning at 7:30, it 

was announced this week by C & S Equipment Co., the 
John Deere dealer in this area. 

THE PROGRAM includes "Furrow-on-Film" subjects 
which show the latest developments in farm management. 
These films provide guidance that could affect your plans 
today and in the years to come. Also included will be 
motion pictures showing the new John Deere Combine 
Platforms, Planters, Powr-Till Seeders, 	and other farm 
equipment being introduced for 1976. equipment 

 

Two John Deere Charcoal Kettle Grills and a two-quart 
John Deere Stainless Steel Vacuum Bottle will be given 
away as door prizes, G. P. Dyer said. He also said dinner 
will be served. 

Western 
Division 

May we introduce:  

Bill Rowe 
A native of Fairview, Okla., 

Bill joined Western Ammonia 
Sept. 	15 	as 	a 	welder 	and 
mechanic. 

He's a graduate of Northern 
Oklahoma College at Tonkawa, 
where he played basketball and 
baseball. He holds an associate 
degree 	in 	agronomy 	with 	a 
minor in chemistry, and hopes 
to 	ble 	is training to 
use forWesternAmmonia in 
the future. 

	

In addition to athletics, 	Bill 
enjoys 	hunting, 	fishing 	and 

. 	
rodeoing 1"I used to rope quite 

bit"). 
He and his wife, Pam, live at 

Andrews Trailer Park with their 
Brittany 	spaniel, 	Sissy. 	Pam 
works for the Austin Company, 
which 	is 	building 	the 	new 

C Amstar 	orp. refinery. 
 

Ammonia 
of Goodpasture, Inc. 
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/ rilitrw 	 P04004e0 M ug v Bruegel Bros. Gin & Elevator 
51,,  Miles North of Tam Anne 



Thursday, January 22, 1976 THE CASTRO COUNTY NEWS, DIMMITT, TEXAS Page 

Ekrozwznia.zarructorrattrx  --durrop 

Happy 

647-3123 For Printing 

How and hobby.  

Mushroom, a non-vegetable, 
is a good dish for dieters 

Club formed 
for mothers 
of twins 

Rotation makes Good and bad 
'tators' topic 
for Iota Zeta Socially 

Yours 
old toys 'new' 

By now the "newness" may 
have worn off this year's 
Christmas toys and the children 
are bored with their playthings, 
says Ilene Miller, a family life 
education specialist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. 

"PARENTS often complain 
that their child has a room full 
of toys he doesn't play with and 
he doesn't seem to appreciate 
all they've done for him." 

If this sounds familiar, Mrs. 
Miller suggested that the key 
to understanding is to see the 
situation from the child's point 
of view. Children have short 
attention spans and may lose 
interest in the toys they play 
with day after day. 

"Toys are not as appealing if 
the child sees and uses them 
everyday. So alternate some of 
his toys. 

"When the child's interest in 
his toys begins to fade, it's 
time to bring some toys back 
from 'vacation' and put other 
toys out of sight for a while," 
she advised. 

anniversary! 
7fica_umiccErxEciapcuirmicatt 

(Compiled from the Commu-
nity. Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration, 
Council and the Nazareth Am-
erican Legion Auxiliary.] 

JAN. 22 — Dennis and 
Katherine Husema9, Arlene 
and Mackey Oldfield, Bill and 
Kay Conyers. 

JAN. 23 — Gail and Carl 
Bruegel. 

JAN. 24 — Jean and Larry 
Morris. 

JAN. 25 — Deborah and 
Steve Sharp. 

JAN. 27 — James and 
Chunky Wilhelm. 

JAN. 28 — Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Schulte, Mitzie and 
Cyril Brockman. 

Members of Iota Zeta Chap-
ter of Delta Kappa Gamma 
were advised at their first 1976 
meeting to be "good tators--
cognitators, commentators, 
mediators" — in the coming 
year rather than "bad tators—
agitators, hesitators, dictators 
or spectators." 

JO ANNE Snider was the 
narrator for the program as two 
high school juniors, Darla 
Hicks and Kelly Bagley, acted 
each part. 

Koma Ratcliff, president, 
commended the Personal 
Growth and Service Committee 
and Sue Broderson on the 
Christmas program, when 
members and guests had a 
Javanese meal and saw a skit, 
— Hats Off to You." 

The next meeting will be in 
Helen Richardson Elementary 
School. Members are all asked 
to participate in a hobby sale, 
the money to go into the schol-
arship fund and donations for 
the coming year. 

Mothers of twins in this area 
are invited to join a recently 
formed club at Hereford which 
last week voted to join the Na-
tional Organization of Mothers 
of Twins. 

THE NEXT meeting of the 
Hereford group will be at 4 
p.m. Feb. 3 in the Caison 
House Restaurant. Mrs. John 
Avent, 228 Elm, is the new 
president, Mrs. Dee Willard 
national representative and 
Mrs. Bruce Futrell membership 
chairman. 

Purpose of the club is to as-
sist mothers of twins with their 
special problems by providing 
information and exchanging ex-
periences. Also the national 
organization participates in 
medical and educational re-
search relating to twins. 

The local club has planned a 
schedule of programs including 
some for evenings when fathers 
of the twins may also attend, 
Mrs. Avent announces. 

By IRENE KEATING temperature, light and humid-
ity. 

Select white firm, slightly 
moist mushrooms. They are 
perfectly good when opened or 
if they have brown spots on 
them. Size doesn't affect taste. 

You don't need to peel mush-
rooms. Rinse them quickly in a 
light stream of cold water, 
never let them soak. Cook no 
longer than 10 minutes in a 
little butter or margarine with 
salt and pepper to taste. 

It is nice to be home again 
after my two weeks at College 
Station. I was participating in a 
graduate course at A&M and 
really enjoyed it. I am now 
more familiar with many insti-
tutions and how they operate to 
bring about changes. 

HOW ARE you doing on the 
goals you set for 1976? I hope 
you are making progress and 
will reach your goal. If one of 
your goals is weight reduction 
you'll be glad (or will you?) to 
know that mushrooms have 
only 66 calories per pound and 
contain good amounts of phos-
phorus, riboflavin, niacin and 
other B vitamins. 

Did you know that the mush-
room cannot be called a veg-
etable? It has no green coloring 
matter and cannot take carbon 
dioxide from the air. It is a 
fungus produced from spores 
under precise conditions of 

Remove carpet grease spots 
caused by holiday traffic by 
pouring a generous amount of 
baking soda or corn meal on 
the spot. Work it into the pile 
with your fingers. Leave it 
overnight and vacuum off the 
next day, suggests Lynn Bour-
land, family resource manage-
ment specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service. 

An adult antelope can run at 
speeds up to 60 mph, but day-old 
offspring can't keep up. They can 
run only 25 mph. 

—SPORTS AFIELD 

&Mores/ &Mores/ iedersesi 

10 BIG 
DAYS 

Renee Hughes and Kenneth Doss 
THE PLACE TO GO! 

Wedding plans made NOW IS THE TIME TO STOCK YOUR LINEN CLOSET WITH THE MOST RESPECTED NAME IN BED AND BATH FASHIONS, 

FIELDCREST! ...USE YOUR COBB'S CHARGE OR LAY-AWAY IF YOU WISH 
Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Grand 

of Dimmitt and Jimmy B. 
Hughes of Houston announce 
the approaching marriage of 
their daughter, Renee Hughes, 
to Kenneth Doss, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Doss of Dim-
mitt. 

THE MARRIAGE will take 
place at 7 p.m. Feb. 21 in the 
First Baptist Church of Dim-
mitt. 

Sale... itaggrest Relatives and friends of the 
couple are invited to attend the 
ceremony. 

Feb. 28 vows planned ENTIRE STOCK 

BEDSPREADS Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Stengel 
of Route 5, Hereford, announce 
the engagement of their daugh-
ter, Babette, to David Spin-
hirne of Dalhart, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Spinhirne of 
Dimmitt. 

THE WEDDING is planned 
for Feb. 28 in St. Anthony's 
Catholic Church of Hereford. 

Miss Stengel is a sophomore 
at West Texas State University 
and a graduate of Hereford 
High School. Her fiance, also a 
Hereford High graduate, farms 
northwest of Dalhart. 

WOVEN OR QUILTED 

DOUBLE OR TWIN 
wi 

15% OFF 

il:hyderlle 
&wit 

Taek  

THERMAL BLANKETS 

ge/deres1 
TOWELS 

BABETTE STENGEL 
. . . To wed David Spinhirne 

100% Polyester 

WINDSONG 
Miss Roark 
to be feted 

By SUE COLEMAN Solid colors - Neva-shed Treatment - 5" Taffeta 
Binding - Colors, pink, gold, green, blue, white NOVELLA 

Tone on Tone Floral 
Reg. Sale 

Bath Towel 4.50...3.75 
Hand Towel 3.00...2.25 
Wash Cloth 1.35...1.05 

LUSTRE 
Soft Touch Solid Dobby 
Border 

GARDEN PARTY 
Picked Field Flower on 
Honeycomb Ground 

Reg. Sale 
Bath Towel 4.25...3.50 
Hand Towel 2.75...1.99 
Wash Cloth 1.30... .99 

People who have special in-
terests are usually the most in-
teresting people and I've met a 
couple lately who bear out that 
observation. 

CLARA VICK is secretary of 
the county historical association 
and like all of its members is 
particularly interested right 
now in getting a Castro County 
museum started. 

She is also my next-door 
neighbor during business 
hours, which are the hours that 
loom largest for most employed 
women. 

It's very convenient to drop 
into the Cowsert Abstract office 
to get information about mu-
seum planning—and fun to 
visit Clara and the other wo-
men who work there. 

Double 80 x 90 
Queen 95 x 90 
King 108 x 90 

Reg. 14.98...10.99 
Reg. 19.98...15.99 
Reg. 21.98...18.99 

A bridal shower honoring 
Leigh Ann Roark, daughter of 
Rev. and Mrs. Marvin Roark 
and bride-elect of Billy R. 
Jones of Stamford, will be an 
event of Saturday morning in 
the home of Mrs. George 
Sides. 

ALL FRIENDS are invited; 
no individual invitations will be 
issued by the hostesses. 

Miss Roark and Jones, both 
students in McMurry College 
at Abilene, are to be married 
Feb. 21 in the First United 
Methodist Church here. 

VELVET TOUCH 
100% Nylon Fibers permanently Bonded to a foam 
base - Deep Dyed Solid Color - 2" self hem - reusable 
vinyl storage bag - Colors, sable, red, royal, green. CELEBRATION 

Sale 
5.50 
2.99 
1.19 

Reg. 
Bath Towel 6.50 
Hand Towel 3.75 
Wash Cloth 1.50 

Plush, Elegant Jacquard 
-Extra Heavy, Extra 

Large- 

Reg. Sale 
Bath Towel 12.50 10.50 
Hand Towel 6.75 	5.75 
Wash Cloth 2.40 	1.99 

Double 80 x 90 
Queen 95 x 90 

Reg. 24.98.. 19.99 
Reg. 33.98...27.99 

CAPRICE 
Jacquard — Fringed 

Unsheared 
Reg. Sale 

Bath Towel 3.98 	3.25 
Hand Towel 2.49 	2.15 
Wash Cloth 1.25 	.99 

PRINT BLANKETS 
FRAGRANCE BLANKET 

Multicolor Flowers on White Grounds. Yellow Bor-
ders, 80°/o Acrylic, 20% Nylon 

Tour of home 
feature of 
club program 

MEXICANI 
Adapted from a Mexi- 
can Blanket of Early 
1800's 

ALSO concerned with county 
history and its relation to the 
US Bicentennial year is Mrs. 
John Merritt, who helped ar-
range the Book Club's first an-
tiques display at the library and 
graciously invited me to see it 
and be a Book Club guest last 
week. 

That was a treat because it 
was a chance to meet not only 
Sue Merritt but the other club 
members and the attractive 
guest reviewer, Mrs. George 
McDaniel of Borger, the sister 
of the program chairman, Leora 
Little. 

Not to mention the hostess-
es, Mona Merritt and Oleta 
Gollehon, who served coffee 
with some very tasty cookies. 

PATIENCE ROSE 
Stylized Flower on 
Champagne Grounds 

Reg. Sale 
Bath Towel 4.25...3.50 
Hand Towel 2.75...1.99 
Wash Cloth 1.29 	99 

Double 72 x 90 
King 102 x 90 

Reg. 12.98 „ . 9.99 
Reg. 17.98.. .13.99 

•TWIN BED SIZE 
• DOUBLE BED SIZE 
• QUEEN SIZE 
• KING SIZE 
• PILLOW CASES 

Reg. Sale 
Bath Towel 6.25.. 5.25 
Hand Towel 3.60...2.85 
Wash Cloth 1.60...1.30 

MEISSEN ROSE BLANKET 
Multicolor flowers on white grounds. Blue Borders. 
100% Creslan Acrylic, 100% Nylon Bindings. 

A tour of Mrs. W. E. Kirk-
patrick's home by members 
and guests of the Town and 
Country Home Demonstration 
Club followed the January club 
meeting recently. 

OF SPECIAL interest in the 
Kirkpatrick hcme is a room 
decorated in the Bicentennial 
theme. 

Members of the Bethel and 
Flagg HD Clubs were guests 
for the tour and the preceding 
program which was presented 
by Mrs. Glenn Reeve of Friona. 

Mrs. Reeve showed her col-
lection of 16 dolls dressed in 
authentic copies of costumes 
worn by the brides in White 
House weddings. She told the 
story of each wedding, giving 
interesting sidelights on the 16 
brides. 

Reg. 24.98...19.99 Double 80 x 90 
1 	 

TABLE CLOTHS KITCHEN TERRIES FIELD CREST 

COMFORTERS ALL BED PILLOWS 70 Rounds, Ovals, Oblongs 
Solids and Patterns 

Dish Cloths - Cup Towels 
Pot Holders - Aprons 100% Polyester, Double Bed or Kings Double Beds — Queen — Kings — Large Assortment 

15% OFF 15% OFF  15% OFF 15% OFF 
WHETHER or not you are an 

antiques buff you'd probably 
like to see the exhibit at the 
library, expecially Nancy Hays'  
century-old quilt that was made 
for her father when he was a 
baby by his mother. 

You can look at all the hand 
stitching—embroidery, fagot-
ing, feather-stitching and doz-
ens more varieties, and marvel. 

ENTIRE STOCK FIELD CREST 

ELECTRIC BLANKETS 
Twin, Doubles [single Control or Double control), 
Queen and Kings, Dual Controls. 

Entire Stock 

RUGS— RUG SETS 
Large Assortment of Colors 
and Styles to Choose 

TAYLOR MADE 

MATTRESS PADS 
Twins — Double — Queen — Kings 

15% OFF 15% OFF 15% OFF 
• 



on a five-day fishing trip re-
cently. 

Heathe Allen, David and De-
nise Hampton came home with 
them to finish the school term 
here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Akers of 
Lubbock spent the Jan. 17-18 

CINDY SADLER participated 
in the all-regional band tryouts 
in Littlefield recently. She was 

named third alternate. 
Mrs. Winston Waggoner and 

Dalia Gregory were honored 
with a birthday supper in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Gregory Jan. 11. 

weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
John Spencer. They honored 
Noah Spencer with a birthday 
supper Saturday night. 

Charlie Hall Jones flew a 
group of friends to Old Mexico 

ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

BUILDING 
MATERIALS 

CAPABLE—
DEPENDABLE 

Phone 938-2183 
Hart, Texas or Your Drying and Storage Nee 

Call: 
MERLE L. LISTER 

& SONS Inc. 
144 West Third 	Hereford, Texas 

* CRANE RENTAL SERVICE 

364.5352 
Distributors For: 

CONRAD CORRUGATED STEEL BINS 
REDEX PORTABLE AND STATIONARY DRYERS 

KELLEY DUPLEX GRAIN HANDLING EQUIPMENT 
All.  Types Grain Cleaners 

4 

a 
fa 

TREFLAN $119255gi  
ERADICANE $189.1  
ATTREX 	$25° lb 

MILOGARD $253  ib  

RI  HEPTACHLOR $235  e.  

CASH 
(WHILE IT LASTS!) 

EARTH AG 
SUPPLY, INC. 

Earth, Texas 
806-257-3762 

01.1.1a !almil-le. 	OPAILi.ONME 

Pays 14 
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Riley brothers 
By TEENY BOWDEN 

win ribbons 

lin= 	 11111011111 	• 

MR. AND MRS. Larry Don 
Bills returned home from their 
skiing trip Tuesday. 

Quint Waggoner attended 
the Dimmitt 4-H meeting Tues-
day afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Heizer 
were among a group of spon-
sors from the First United 
Methodist Church in Dimmitt 
who took a group of youth to 
Ruidoso last weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Gilbreath 
and Mr. and Mrs. Doug Hig-
gins of Hart flew to Miami Sun-
day morning for the Super 
Bowl game. They came home 
Tuesday. Mr. and Mrs. R. S. 
Rogers came to stay with the 
boys while they were gone. 

Mr. and Mrs. Euless Wag-
goner went through the mu-
seum in Hereford last Sunday 
afternoon and visited with 
friends Mr. and Mrs. C. R. 
Gandy. 

1 

Kevin and Jodie Riley show-
ed lambs in the 4-H Stock Show 
in Littlefield over the weekend. 
They brought home two blue 
ribbons, two red ribbons, one 
champion of breed, and two 
reserve champion trophies. Jo-
die received honorable mention 
for showmanship. Kevin won a 
pig in the drawing. 

MR. AND MRS. Gale Sadler 
and Cindy, Mr. and Mrs. R. J. 
Lefevere, Carl Bradley. Robert 
Duke, Mrs. Cliff Brown and 
Mrs. L. B. Bowden attended 
the Castro County Bicentennial 
committee meetings in Dimmitt 
Thursday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Bradley 
attended the organizational 
meeting of all singers in the 
county in Dimmitt Tuesday 
night to make plans for the Bi-
centennial. 

Robert Duke and Mrs. L. B. 
Bowden were part of a group 
representing the County His-
torical Committee who met 
with the commissioners' court 
Monday afternoon concerning a 
building for a proposed mu-
seum for Castro County. 

Embree Roy Sadler and L. B. 
Bowden attended a hail sup-
pression meeting in Earth 
Monday night. 

MR. AND MRS. Cliff Brown 
and Mrs. L. B. Bowden at-
tended the salad supper of the 
Castro County Genealogical So-
ciety in Rhoads Memorial Lib-
rary Thursday night. Carlton 
Moyers, librarian, was the 
guest speaker. 

Mrs. Embree Roy Sadler 
presided at the Plains Mem-
orial Hospital Auxiliary meet-
ings in Dimmitt Wednesday 
morning. Mrs.- John Gilbreath 
attended also. 

Mrs. Cecil Curtis was hon-
ored with a birthday party in 
her home Monday afternoon by 
the Birthday Club. Those pres-
ent were Mrs. Floyd Ivey, Mrs. 
Lillie King, Mrs. Roy Phelan 
from the community and Mrs. 
Ray Axtell, Mrs. J. E. Shirey 
and Mrs. Mae Hamilton, all of 
Earth. 

Mrs. Ellis Carter of Hereford 

NOTICE 

CITY & SCHOOL 

■ 

Hubert Lilley, who died un-
expectedly Jan. 6 in Wichita 
Falls General Hospital, had 
moved to the Sunnyside com-
munity with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. S. W. (Scoot) Lille),  in 
1923 from Callahan County. 
His twin brothers Ray and Roy 
were born the following year. 

Hubert attended the Abbott 
school until it was abandoned. 
He then went to Hart a few 
years and then to Sunnyside. 
He graduated from Olton High 
School. He and Alene Arm-
strong were married in 1934 
and they made their home 

[Editor's Note: The following 
Sunnyside news was delayed in 
the mail last week.[ 

A&M to conduct 
bankers' school 

AVOID PENALTY 

YOU MUST PAY YOUR CITY AND 
• 

• • 

I 

Dimmitt 
Public Schools 

City of 
Dimmitt 

here. Their three children Ma-
vis, Jean and Freddy were born 
and raised in the community. 
He was baptized into the 
church here in 1955 and he 
farmed in the community until 
he retired several years ago. 

Pallbearers were L. J. Rice, 
Ed Bennett, Lloyd David and 
Wilbur Vaughn, all of Hart, 
Carl Bradley and Gary Lilley 
and John Bridges of Earth. 
Honorary pallbearers were 
Weldon Bradley and Howard 
Bridges of Dimmitt, Jud David 
and Delford Davis of Hart, 
Embree Roy and Ezell Sadler 
and J. C. Holbrooks. 

MRS. HERSHEL Wilson un-
derwent minor surgery at 
Methodist Hospital in Lubbock 
recently. 

Eddie Waggoner was featur-
ed in the January issue of the 
Farmer-Stockman magazine, 
regarding his corn contracts 
which have been quite success-
ful for him for the last four 
years. He has averaged over 
$100 more profit per acre with 
his corn on contract than by 
growing grain sorghum and 
selling it on the open market. 
His contract calls for a 141/2  
percent moisture content and 
this waiting for the corn to dry 
is the greatest disadavantage. 
He grows 500 acres and av-
eraged 7,500 lbs. per acre last 
year. 

Dr. Strauss Atkinson of 
Plainview, area missionary, 
taught the book of Hosea at the 
church recently. 25 took the 
course which was the January 
Bible study emphasis. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Cox have 
enrolled in Hyles-Anderson 
College in Hammond, Ind. 

Kevin and Jodie Riley show-
ed lambs recently in the Odes-
sa Stock Show. It was Jodie's 
first show. 

* 
DIXIE BYFORD was honored 

with a going-away party at the 
church recently by the youth of 
the church and several adult 
sponsors. She is now making 
her home in Amarillo. Mrs. 
Neal Parson, Ervin and Laura 
of Muleshoe and Sharon Cock-
rum were guests. Games were 
played and refreshments serv-
ed. Pictures were taken and 
she was presented an auto-
graphed book, a photo album 
and a certificate from the 
church. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Don Bills 
enjoyed a skiing trip to Red 
River recently. David and An-
gie stayed with their grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. R. V. Bills. 

Gerald Elkins suffered a 
painful injury to his nose re-
dently while working with cat-
le in a cattle chute. He was 

heated in Littlefield, but was 
not hospitalized. Several stitch-
es were required to close a 
deep gash and repair a torn 
ligament. 

Jackie Clark, a lab technician 
at Methodist Hospital in Lub-
bock, had dinner with Mr. and 
Mrs. Noah Spencer irecently, 
and made plans with them con-
cerning the plumbing for a 
dialysis unit for the home. 

Mrs. Jerry Wayne Hampton 
and Dina Jo visited in Pecos 
recently with relatives. Brid:et, 

• 
I 

Texas bankers dealing with 
agricultural loans must have 
firsthand knowledge about 
what's down the road for var-
ious agricultural commodities. 
And that's what they're going 
to get at the 24th Texas Farm 
and Ranch Credit School for 
Commercial Bankers, Feb. 9-
11, at the Rudder Center, 
Texas A&M University. 

A SPECIAL session will pro-
vide "outlook" information on 
livestock, cotton, grain and the 
money market, points out Dr. 
Richard Trimble, economist in 
management for the Texas Ag-
ricultural Extension Service. 
Speakers will be Extension 
specialists Dr. Ed Uvacek and 
Roland Smith; Dr. Philip 
Gramm, Texas A&M professor 
of economics (currently on 
leave); and Dan Davis of Lub-
bock, general manager of the 
Plains Cotton Cooperative As-
sociation. 

A special Agricultural Credit 
Analysis Workshop will begin 
the afternoon of Feb. 11 and 
continue through the morning 
of Feb. 13. The workshop will 
deal with preparing financial 
statements, analyzing and re-
conciling farm records, and 
preparing cash flow projec-
tions. Case problems will also 
be studied and solved, points 
out Trimble. 

a 
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in Littlefield 4-H show 

SCHOOL TAXES BY JANUARY 31 sr 
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spent the day Tuesday with her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. R. E. 
Duke. Mrs. Embree Roy Sad-
ler, Mrs. Goldie Thompson, 
Mrs. Alton Loudder, Mrs. Roy 
Phelan and Mrs. L. B. Bowden 
visited with them a while Tues-
day morning. 

THE LIONS Club met Mon-
day night for their regular 
meeting and supper. 

Rev. and Mrs. Raymond 
Jones attended the Evangelism 
Conference in Fort Worth Mon-
day through Thursday and vis-
ited with her mother Mrs. Mae 
Etta Watts of Fort Worth be-
tween sessions. They came 
back to Abilene Thursday and 
visited with their son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Jones and Ray. Mrs. Jones 
stayed to visit with them next 
week. Rev. Jones came home 
Friday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Milburn Hay-
don also attended the Evange-
lism Conference with the 
Joneses this week and went on 
to Weatherford Wednesday 
evening to visit with his mother 
Mrs. Raymond Haydon. 

Roy Phelan had charge of the 
Wednesday night prayer ser-
vice in the absence of the 
pastor. 

MR. AND MRS. Alton Loud-
der went with the Lowell West-
moreland family of Littlefield to 
Dimmitt last Friday night to 
see the Dimmitt-Littlefield 
girls' varsity game. Lori West-
moreland plays on the Little-
field team. Mrs. Loudder went 
with Mrs. Westmoreland and 
children to see Gena West-
moreland play with the fresh-
man team in the Dimmitt-
Littlefield game Monday night. 

Mrs. Ray Joe Riley gave a 
patriotic program before the 
Springlake-Earth PTA Tuesday 
afternoon. 

Hershel Wilson and Roy Phe-
lan visited with Earl Phelan of 
Fieldton Wednesday. 

Lynn Brown, Pat Fulfer and 
Baldamoro Sauceda won their 
game over Kress Thursday 
night, lost to Bovina Friday 
night and lost to Hart Saturday 
night in the J.V. tournament at 
Hart this weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Embree Roy 
Sadler vsited in Lubbock Friday 
with Mr. and Mrs. M. H. 
Fowlkes. 

* 
MR. AND MRS. Hershel 

Wilson and Daneen were in 
Morton Saturday and Saturday 
night to participate in a March 
of Dimes benefit. Mr. Wilson 
and the Singing Disciples were 
part of the entertainment. 

Nancy Woods of Happy visit-
ed Sunday afternoon with Mr. 
and Mrs. Noah Spencer. 

Lee Brown and Joe Fulfer 
participated with the Spring-
lake-Earth varsity team as they 
won their game over Kress 
Tuesday night and lost to Hart 
Friday night. 

Oral Crabb was admitted to 
Plains Memorial Hospital in 
Dimmitt Monday and has been 
in the hospital all week. 

Several from the community 
attended the Dimmitt-Morton 
game in Levelland Friday 
night. 

Mrs. Ezell Sadler, Mrs. Lar-
ry Sadler, Mrs. David Sadler, 
Mrs. Embree Roy Sadler and 
Mrs. Gale Sadler attended the 
bridal shower in Earth Satur-
day morning honoring Mrs. 
Bobby Cummings. 



1973 MERCURY MONTEGO MX 
2 door hardtop, one owner, automatic, with air conditioner. 	'2250. This car should sell for s2865"--OUR PRICE THIS WEEK ONLY 

1974 Dodge Dart 
318 V-8, Automatic, 4-door sedan 
with air conditioning. This car will 
save you money when you buy-and 
when you drive it. 

1972 Chevrolet Impala 
4-door sedan, automatic, V-8, with 
air. This car will sell this week at 
some price. Come by and drive it 

today. 

1974 Plymouth Sebring 
2-door hardtop, 318 V-8, automatic, 
and air conditioning. This car will 

make anybody a car to keep. 

1973 Ford Pickup XLT 
Ranger, V-8, automatic, with air 
conditioning. Local owner. This pickup 
is priced so low, you have to come 
and see. 

1972 Chevrolet Pickup 
V-8, automatic with air & power. This 
week only priced at 

'1750 
The boss is still gone and we 

are having a good sale thanks 

to you. Come by and talk to: 

LEON ROMO-VICTOR CANTU-DON HENSLEE-DALE JONES 

Jones Motors 

Henry Block has 
17 reasons why 

you should come 
to us for income 

tax help. 

.4 .... ,. 4 

Reason 2 At H&R Block our 
once is based on the 
complexity of your return 
The simpler the return, the 
less we charge 

647-4177 

H&R BLOCK 
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

116 W Bedford 

100  
ofx 

Savings Accounts 
We're kind of a money farm. You plant a few 
dollars w,t h us on a regular basis, and in no time 
they sprout into enough to have a field day with. 

Open a Green Pastures savings account at The 
\lonev Growers Association. We pay acres of 
interest compounded daily. Plant the seeds, now. 

THE" 51/4%-  6 1/2% -7 3/4% 
MONEY 
GROWERS 
ASSOCIATION 

112-  E. Jones' 

Dimmitt . 
"We look to your future with interest." 

1975 lton Shale Ge..th Ath .164 

hi-plains savings &loan 
647- 21 ic9 

HOSPITAL NEWS 
PATIENTS IN THE HOSPITAL 

Patterson Bain 
Misty Michelle Correa 
Cinnamon Cox 
Guadalupe Espinosa 
Candelaria Flores 
Elida Flores 
Rafael Galvan 
Leon Gilliland 
Woodrow Jones 
Josie Martin 
Jimmie Pinner 
J. B. Raper 
Grace Sanders 
Modesta Sandoval 
James Slough 
Jennie Staton 
Agnes Studer 
Jessie Thomas 
Esther VanDoren 
J. 0. Vaughn 

PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
Kay Kellar 
Kay Magee 
Neva Hedgecoke 
Emma Martinez 
W. E. Grant 
Elida Gonzales 
Jessie Hutcheson 
Susan Miller 
B. L. Rudd 
Lois Waggoner 
Fred Goldsmith 
Harold Staton 
Ramiro Esquivel 
John Wait, Jr. 
Juana Guajardo 
Oral Crabb 
Thelma Bryson 
Katy Burkett 

CAGE SCHEDULE 
Here are the varsity bas-

ketball schedules for the com-
ing week: 

DIMMITT 
Friday — Bobbies vs. Floyd-

ada, there. 
Saturday — Bobcats vs. Floyd-

ada at Amarillo Civic Center, 
5:15 p.m. 

Tuesday — Friona, there. 
(Girls' games start at 6:30; 

boys' games begin at 8. Varsity 
games are usually preceded by 
boys' and/or girls' junior var-
sity games.) 

HART 
Friday — Farwell, there. 
Tuesday — Vega, there. 

(Junior varsity games start at 
5.30, girls' games at 7 and 
boys' games at 8:30.) 

NAZARETH 
Friday — Amherst, there. 
Tuesday — Happy, there 

Here are the junior games 
scheduled for the coming week. 
ing week. 

DIMMITT 
Thursday through Saturday — 

Eighth grade boys and girls, 
Hart tournament. 
.ursday through Saturday —
Eighth grade boys and girls, 
Olton tournament. 

Friday — B girls, Floydada, 
there. 

Monday — 7-8-9 boys, Friona.  
there. 

Monday — 7-8-9 girls, Friona 
here. 

Tuesday — B boys and girls, 
Friona, there. 

NAZARETH 
Friday — B girls, Amherst, 

there, 4:30. 
Monday — 8th grade boys and 
girls, Cotton Center, there. 
Tuesday — B boys, Happy, 

there, 4:30. 

Square dancers 
go to festival 

The Nazareth Kurlie Q's en-
tertained guests with an eve-
ning of square dancing at their 
regular meeting, after they had 
traveled to Amarillo for the an-
nual Winter Festival Friday 
and Saturday nights. 

THE FESTIVAL was held in 
the Villa Inn Convention Center 
with Beryl Mann calling the 
squares. 

At the dance in Nazareth's 
American Legion Hall, a spec-
ial tip was called by Eston Brit-
ling of Tulia in addition to the 
squares called by Weymon 
Box. 

Guests were members of the 
Shirts and Skirts of Tulia, also 
the Ray Kennedys from Ed-
mondson and M. Wilson from 
Hart. Hostesses who served re-
freshments were Christine and 
Margie Wilhelm, Sister Adrian 
Wevers and Nicky Book. 

James Wilhelm, president, 
announced the activities set up 
for Buenavista on Saturday, 
Jan. 31. The next club dance 
will begin at 7:30 p.m. Feb. 1 
in the American Legion Hall. 

GEORGE Washington died 
in the last hour, of the last day, 
of the last week, of the last 
month, of the last year, of the 
18th Century. His death came 
between 11 p.m. and midnight 
Dec. 31, 1799. 

7th grade teams win third at Olton 
Dimmitt seventh grade boys 

and girls both won third place 
in the Olton Junior High Tour-
nament with decisive victories 
in the finals, after both had lost 
to Littlefield teams in close 
semifinal games. 

THE DIMMITT boys defeat-
ed Shallowater 36-15 Saturday 
evening to take third in the 
tourney. 

They met Hale Center in the 
first game Thursday, rolling up 
a 32-15 victory, then dropped 
the semifinal contest to Little-
field, 29-33. 

Olton was the girls' opponent 

Saturday evening when Dim-
mitt piled up a 35-3 score. 

In the semifinals Friday Lit-
tlefield edged Dimmitt's girls 
24-22. The opener against Hale 
Center Thursday went to Dim-
mitt, 22-8. 

Most people cope with life. 
Coping is like a "C" on an 
exam—you squeak by, you 
don't cop out, you don't fail, 
but you don't excel, Dorthy 
Taylor, family life education 
specialist with the Texas Agri-
cultural Extension Service, 
says. 

BETH CLEVELAND appears to be doing a 
stag leap here, but she's actually going up for 
a rebound and getting the jump on Morton 
guards Debbie Polvado [33) and Ryleen Wells 
(31) in the second quarter of Friday night's 
game at Levelland. As it turned out, the 

rebound wasn't necessary as the shot dropped 
to extend the Bobbies' lead to 33.8. The 
Bobbies won the contest by a convincing 
71-42 score to stay in the lead in the District 
3-AA race. 
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* * 
for the great reception you've given us here. 
Your response has been even better than we had  

* 

* 
* expected. We look forward to serving you for 	* 
* many years! 	 * 

* * 
* 647-4164 	 * *-4(4-40Psol---***************************** 

We at K-Bob's want to 

I 	 * 
* * 
* * Tkault geu 

* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* 	 * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 
* * 

Rex and Robbin — Cooks 
Stefanie, Nita, Margaret, Cindy, 

Delia, Cheryl and Shandra 
Waitresses 

Zelma — Salads 
Sam Jr., Ricardo and Joe 

General Helpers 
Jane — Dishwasher 
Wilma and Les — Managers 

* * 
* * K-13616 Steak Howe 

200 W. Bedftvid 
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• On the go 
Terry, Kathy, Brent arid 

Clint Hill from Granbury visit-
ed her mother Florene Leinen 
and his dad Charlie Hill and 
family last week. 

currently around $40, but this 
price is dropping and lower 
prices for the alarms are ex-
pected to increase sales sharply 
in older homes. Some manu-
facturers are looking for the 
market to develop into a $200 
million a year giant by 1980. 

Thursday, January 22, 1976 

IT WAS Benjamin Franklin 
who said, "Keep your eyes 
wide open before marriage, 
half shut afterward." 

CUP 0 CHILI 
h', 	FRITO Pie 
:•/ 1  CORN DOG 

ONION RINGS 
TATER TOTS 
FRENCH FRIES 
BURRITO 

CHILI 
CANC.)Ne • GUM • FRIED 

LARGE DILL PICKLES HOT P 

COKI OR PEPPER 
sPRITf ROOT BEER 
FL CATS 

IML DRINK 

DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

(formerly Webb-Mears 

Engine) 

•King Offset Discs 

•Briggs & Stratton 

Sales & Service 

•Allis-Chalmers 

Phone 647-2573 

P.O. Box 576 

On 
Wall Street 

By Bob Hill 
THE IDEAL SITUATION A. G. Edwards & Sons, Inc. 

stallation of the alarms in new 
homes. The sales of home 
smoke alarms has doubled in 
just the past two years. 

Retail price of the units is 

Is to get a credit bureau 

report before granting 

credit. But, when you are 

troubled with an unpaid 

account, the collection 

service of your credit 

bureau can help you. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
116 W. Bedford 

	 -- 

The home smoke detector quires smoke alarms in all new 
market is heating up. Two houses built with funds from 
major manufacturing giants are the Federal Housing Admin-
going all out to get their smoke istration. State and local build-
detectors well established in ing codes are requiring the in-
the market. Norelco and Gen-
eral Electric are both going full 
blast to snare a major share of 
what is termed "the hottest 
market around." According to 
an officer of Norelco, "The fire 

Burger franchise here, and Dannie Kemp, manager of the new 
business. City and Chamber of Commerce officials taking part 
are [from left] Bill Clark, Jerry Marvin, Garnett Holland, 
Robert Ryan, Bob Caddell and Robert McLean. The Chamber 
of Commerce also presented the new business with its first 
dollar of clear profit, mounted on a framed certificate. 

WITH HOT CHOCOLATE?—Mayor Elmer Youth leans out of 
the service window to officially cut the ribbon for the new Mr. 
Burger at 302 S. Broadway Monday morning. The traditional 
ceremony was conducted by the city and the Chamber of 
Commerce in a biting-cold wind. At right are John Teters [in 
cap], vice-president of Ranger Enterprises, which owns the Mr. 

Amstar buys 
Milwaukee Too HAYS HAS IT:  

FARMER'S 

SUPPLY CO. 

THE FINEST IN 

Minneapolis-Moline 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO. 

REPAIR 

Building 

Material for 

Every Purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM 

1 BARTLM CO. 

HAYS 
IMPLEMENT 

CO. 

International-Harvester 

Farm Machinery 

Amstar sales volume down 
from record level of '75 

Amstar Corporation reported 
that net sales and operating 
revenues for the quarter ended 
Dec. 31, 1975, the second 
quarter of its fiscal year, were 
S243,788,000, compared with 
5537,589,000 for the compar-
able period a year ago. 

Amstar Corporation an-
nounced that its acquisition of 
Milwaukee Electric Tool Cor-
poration, of Milwaukee, Wis., 
was completed Friday. 

MILWAUKEE Electric Tool 
is a leading manufacturer and 
marketer of portable electric 
power tools for industrial use, 
such as drills, hammers, rout-
ers, grinders, sanders, saws 
and other related products. The 
agreement in principle to ac-
quire Milwaukee Electric Tool 
had been announced Oct. 9. 

* Grain Dryers 

* Holding Bins 

* Pits & Legs 

* Farm Buildings 
FULL TIME 

GOSPEL RADIO 

KWAS 
102 FM 
100,000 WATTS 

Hays Implement Co. 

safety market is as yet un-
tapped." 

• SAFETY experts say the 
smoke detector alarm is the 
first step in proper home fire 
protection, even before a fire 
extinguisher. The self-contain-
ed smoke detector sounds an 
alarm when it senses a fire. 
There are 70 million residences 
in the US and less than 2 
million of them have smoke de-
tection devices. 

Household fires cause about 
200,000 injuries and 7,000 
deaths annually and fire pro-
tection specialists believe these 
figures could be sharply cut 
with more of the smoke de-
tectors installed. 

Some manufacturers of 
smoke detector alarms are con-
centrating on the new home 
construction market, working 
with contractors, architects and 
manufacturers of mobile 
homes. Other companies are 
concentrating on the industrial 
market where the cost of a 
built-in sprinkler system is pro-
hibitive. General Electric and 
Norelco are heading straight 
for the consumer with massive 
TV advertising planned. 

A built-in market already ex-
ists for the alarms. HUD re- 

Amstar said that the acqui-
sition is a further step in its 
program of diversification into 
the industrial equipment busi-
ness. Amstar now manufac-
tures hoists, jacks and other in-
dustrial lifting equipment 
through its Duff-Norton sub-
sidiary. The Perfecting Division 
of Duff-Norton also manufac-
tures fluid power components. 

NET INCOME for the three: 
months was $12,198,000, or 
$2.90 per common share after 
provision for dividends on pre-
ferred stocks, compared with 
$17,379,000, or $4.32 per com-
mon share, a year ago. 

For the first six months of 
fiscal 1976, net sales and op-
erating revenues were $600,-
932,000, compared with 
$1,081,955,000 for the same 
period a year ago. Net income 
was $25,250,000 or $6.05 per 
common share after provision 
for dividends on preferred 
stocks, compared to S34,098,-
000, or $8.58 a common share, 
for last year's first half. 

"We are satisfied with the 
results for the second quarter 
even though they were not as 
high as those attained in the 
same period a year ago," said 
Robert T. Quittmeyer. presi-
dent. "Our sales in the quarter 
were below the record levels at-
tained in the comparable period 
last year, principally because of 
lower sugar prices to consum- 

ers made possible by a re-
duction in the cost of raw cane 
sugar." 

"OUR SECOND quarter re-
sults, like those of the first 
quarter of the current fiscal 
year, reflected a change from 
the extraordinary conditions 
that. prevailed during fiscal 
1975 in our sugar business," 
Quittmeyer continued. "Over 
the past several months, sugar 
prices have been relatively sta-
ble, as world sugar supplies 
appear to be adequate in rela-
tion to anticipated demand. 
Barring unforeseen circumstan-
ces, we do not expect any 
radical change in the market 
during the remainder of our 
fiscal year. It is also significant 
that current physical deliveries 
of refined sugar in the United 
States indicate that sugar con-
sumption may be returning to 
normal levels." 

Quittmeyer noted that Am-
star's cane sugar operations in 
the quarter ending Dec. 31 
achieved better profit margins 
than those attained in last 
year's second quarter. The cor-
poration's profits from its beet 
sugar operations, he said, were 
at satisfactory levels although 
lower than those of the com-
parable quarter in fiscal 1975. 
Amstar's nonsweetener opera-
tions continued to make impor-
tant profit contributions during 
the second quarter of the cur-
rent fiscal year, he stated. 

Amstar is the nation's larg-
est manufacturer of sugar pro-
ducts, sold under the Domino' 
and Spreckels® labels, with 
other activities in corn sweet-
eners, industrial equipment 
and paper and food service 
products. The corporation's 
high fructose corn sweetener is 
marketed under the trademark 
Amerose' 

ulicr".4•41nrek-tvx141•:' 

Hart to host 
TSTA meeting 

The Castro County unit of 
Texas State Teachers Assoc-
iation will meet at 7:30 p.m. 
Jan. 29 in the cafeteria of the 
Hart Public School. 

WAYNE Johnson will be the 
guest speaker. His topic will be 
"The Non-Urban Educators' 
Association." He will discuss 
means by which teachers in 
non-urban schools may have a 
voice in educational programs. 

All You'q? Ever Dreamed of 

In A Tool of Its Kind . . . . 
with the rugged staying power 

to serve you year after year! 

MAKES THE ACRES ROLL 

BY — THE PROFITS ADD-UP 
EXTRA STRONG, ADJUSTABLE HITCH 

Heavy box beam construction takes the beating a 
hitch is bound to get. Single pin adjustment fdr 
perfect line-of-draft hook-up. 	LAcEecto 

"Did anybody remember to bring a rifle, in case a deer Os in here!" 

CABLE TV 

BETTER PICTURE, 

MORE STATIONS! 

SWIVEL HITCH JACK 

Built-in jack makes hook-up a one-man job. 

MOLDBOARD-TYPE SCRAPERS 

Formed of heavy 3 16" steel and mounted for 
simple adjustment. You'll be glad to know that 
not even the scrapers have been slighted when we 
set out to bring you the finest tillage tool on the 
market. 

A Cable hook-up 

makes TV pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

8' 	10' 	12' 	14' 	16' 	18' and 20' Models Available 

Hitch up to Hutch — you're in for some pleasant 
surprises. Surprises like the way it slices into the 
soil putting weeds and stubble roots-up through 
trash or heavy green matte. Positive flotation 
keeps you rolling and plowing at the depth you 
want and the weight is there to prevent bouncing 
around on hard ground. 

Don't wait another season to experience the kind 
of performance you've always wanted — the kind 
that ties into the job and gets it done at a profit 
because you've made fewer passes over the field 
and you really accomplished something while you 
were at it. See your Hutch Master dealer for the 
answer to your tillage problems. 

Agricultural Tools For The Farmer Who Takes Pride In His 

Equipment And Demands A Profit For His Effort 

gr31 230241 Of 9SWIttity CECtOitIL 

DIMMITT 

TV CABLE CO. 
%Jo INSTALLATION 

MEMSER - Of FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 
CHARGE Exclusive Hesston Dealer for Castro County 

2 miles south of Nazareth on FM 168 Phone 647-2364 

111.••••••- 

rio 

COW POKES By Ace Reid 

17I"n"-1-1 111 

954-2225 



Dimmrrr'S DANNY VAUGHAN 1441 BATTLES FOR REBOUND 
During Dimmitt-Morton "big shootout" in Levelland Friday night 

STEAM CLEAN' 
Ap 	your own carpets 
IkA(Atdayourselfprices) 

RENT OUR RINSENVAC-the new compact carpet 
cleaning machine that lifts dirt, grime and residues 
out of carpets 	and does the lob professional 
cleaners charge up to a hundred dollars for. We have 
cleaning supplies which can be purchased 
at a surprisingly law cost. We'll help 
with easy operating instructions 

' "Steam-  is a generic term 
commonly used to describe 
the hot water extraction 
process of carper cleaning 

40: RINSE AC 
0,4 	 CLEANS CARPETS CLEANER. . 

PEEPS THEM CLEANER LONGER 
Rent for only 
$1200  a day 

Reserve RINSENVAC for the day you want to get your carpets really clean 

HENDERSON 
113 

TV,Furniture & Appliance W. Bedford  647-4342 

Hand Towels 
Reg. 1.99 	now 	1.34 
Reg. 1.49 	now 	.99 
Reg. .79 	now 	.53 

McCubbin Ladies 

Panty Hose 
Values to $1" 

Now Only 

Floral 

Bath Towels 
Reg. 5129  

Now Only 	kna. 

HARMAN'S 

Entire Stock of 

Men's Sport Coats 
On Sale! 

Reg. 49.99now 15.00 
Reg. 59.99 now 29.00 
Reg. 79.99now  34.00  

CLEARANCE 

family 
shoes 

One Group Ladies 

Shoes 	1/2  Price 
5.99 Now 3.00 
6.88 Now 3.44 
7.34 Now 3.67 
7.99 Now 4.00 
9.34 Now 4.67 
11.99 Now 6.00 
12.99 Now 6.50 
14.99 Now 7.50 
15.99 Now 8.00 

Entire Stock 

Men's & Boys' 

Dress 
Shoes 

20% Off 
Girls' 

Shoes 

1/3  Off 
Boys' & Girls' 

Cowboy Boots 

20% Off 

95 <04,;i9 
	

V.0 
	

Shirts 
20% 

Off 

Permanent Press 

Boy's Western 

Shirts 

1/3  off 

39.99 Now 32.00 
34.99 Now 28.00 
32.99 Now 26.40 

Big Savings! 
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A daughter, named Mary 
Lynn, was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Abe Austin of Dimmitt 
Tuesday afternoon at the Plains 
Memorial Hospital. The baby 
weighed 7 pounds, 6 ounces. 

DeVaney named to 

Girlstown board 
Elvon DeVaney of Dimmitt 

attended his first board meet-
ing Saturday as a new director 
of Girlstown USA at Whiteface. 

DeVANEY was appointed in 
December to a three-year term 
on the Girlstown board, ef-
fective the first board meeting 
of 1976. 

Sheriff Jack Cartwright also 
is a member of the Girlstown 
board of directors. 

MUMME 
EXCAVATING 

I am 

now operating 

out of 

my home. 

BILL 
MUMME 

Please call 

945-2255 

between 

8 and 10 p.m. 

Happy 
birthday! 

[Compiled from the Commu-
nity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth Am-
erican Legion Auxiliary.[ 

JAN. 22 - Jane Behrends, 
Heidi Bruegel, Larry Witt, 
Steve Handley, Melvin Sum-
mers, Beverly McDaniel, Ruth 
Ann Franklin. 

JAN. 23 - Clara Patton, Bill 
Yokum, Greg Odom, Marie 
Venhaus, Jerry Wilhelm, 
James Wilhelm. 

JAN. 24 - Harold Stephens, 
George Bagwell, Neal Wilhelm, 
Greg Venhaus, Mrs. George 
W. Book. 

JAN. 25 - Jack Bradford, 
Michael Patterson, Karen 
Huseman, Bobby Birkenfeld. 

JAN. 26 - Vicki Yokum, 
Coby Moke, David Gregory, 
Donald Wright, Nellie Wil-
helm, Darryl Birkenfeld, Jim-
my Huseman. 

JAN. 27 - Gregg Sides, 
Roxanne Birkenfeld, Marleen 
Vandegrift, Earl Backus. 

JAN. 28 - Kenneth Irlbeck, 
Annette Hoelting, Herman Bir-
kenfeld. 

JAN. 29 - Mary Louise 
Stone, Kylie Maples, Kelly 
Maples, Jean Schulte, Leo Dur-
bin, Tom Keel. 

Sports 
Afield 

By Ted Kesting 
Panama means "abundance of 

fish" in the language of the Indians 
who were there before Columbus. 
But, currently, Panama seems to 
mean an abundance of world-record 
marine fish. More than 35 records, 
covering 13 different species and 
verified by international anglers' or-
ganizations, have been made in 
Panamanian waters. 

-SPORTS AFIELD 

1, 

JO LYNN WILLIAMS 
. . Scholarship winner 

Legal Secretaries 

award scholarship 
A ..S250 scholarship has been 

awarded by the Deaf Smith-
Castro Counties Legal Secre-
taries Association to Jo Lynn 
Williams of Hereford, a senior 
in Hereford High School who 
plans to attend Amarillo Col-
lege next year and major in 
court reporting. 

CONTRIBUTIONS to the 
scholarship fund were made by 
residents of Castro and Deaf 
Smith Counties. Judges report-
ed difficulty in choosing the 
winner from a field including 
Mary Bossett of Dimmitt, 
Laurie Fishar, Carole Vogel 
and Grace Valdez of Hereford. 

The daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Jack Williams of 
Route 5, Hereford. Jo Lynn has 
a 4.3 grade point average on a 
5.0 scale and is a third-year 
member of the National Honor 
Society. She is a member of the 
Christian Youth Organization 
and a past Worthy Advisor of 
the Order of Rainbow for Girls. 

GOURDS to be used for 
home decoration should be 
washed in soapy water and 
rinsed in clear water to which 
household disinfectant has 
been added. The gourds should 
then be dried in a warm dark 
room for at least three weeks 
before applying water wax or 
white varnish to highlight the 
beautiful fall colors. 

[Continued From Page II 
fessional singer that would 
call for constant travel; she 
prefers her family and the 
singing she does for audien-
ces of neighbors. 

"I've liked to sing all my 
life and it makes me happy 
to entertain people, but I 
don't want a career that 
would take me away from 
home," she says. 

SINGING has actually 
been a part of her life since 
she could talk; she began 
harmonizing with her sister 
at the age of 2. When she 
was 6 she appeared in "Op-
ry" programs at Plainview. 

Before she graduated 
from Plainview High, she 
took part in school musicals. 
About the time she graduat-
ed she began writing songs 
-although she had written 
verses since she started to 
school. 

She had played her bro-
ther's guitar, and bought 
her own after graduation.  

Although she accompanies 
herself often, she likes best 
to sing with a band "be-
cause I worry about that 
guitar when I'm playing it." 

MRS. MORRIS has made 
two records at Fort Worth 
and plans to make an album 
next summer, including her 
own compositions. She gang 
with a band at a club in 
Hereford about two years 
and has entertained at par-
ties in Perryton and Pampa 
several times. 

The former Patsy Ragle, 
she is the daughter of the 
Raymond Ragles, who still 
live in Plainview. She credits 
her sister, now Yvonne Sin-
clair of Abilene, with teach-
ing her how to sing as a 
child. 

Now she helps her sons. 
who all like to sing. But 
that's as far as the family 
voices go, she says, because 
"Doyle says he can't carry a 
tune in a sack, and he's 
right!" 
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More about 

Local singer . . . 

Girl's Knit & Brushed Nylon 

Gown & Pajamas 
1/3  Off 

Reg. 6.99 now only 
Reg. 4.99 now only 
Reg. 3.99 now only 
Reg. 3.49 now only 

Ladies Fall & Winter 

Hand Bags 

1/3  Off 
Throw Rugs & 
Bath Mat Sets 

1/3  Off 
Infants & Toddler 

'/3 Off 

i/3 Off 
Center Stage 

Sportswear 

1/3  Off 
Ladies 

Dresses 

Pant Suits 
Blouses 
Tops & 
Pants 

1/2  Off 

Girl's Knit Tops 
& Blouses 1/2  Off 

Reg. 3.99 now only 1.99 
Reg. 4.99 now only 2.49 
Reg. 5.99 now only 2.99 

4.67 
3.34 
2.67 
2.34 

Coats 

ft 	

A Few Ladies 

Coats 
Left To Clear 

44R 

JANUARY 

Ladies Short & Long 

Robe 1/3  Off 
Ladies, Men's, Boy's & Girl's 

Sweaters 
i/3 Off 

Boy's Jackets 1/3  Off 

Mix & Match With 

Your Favorite 

Shirt or Sport Coat. 

10.00 now 6.67 
12.00 now 8.00 
13.00 now 8.67 
15.00 now 10.00 
16.00 now 10.67 
17.00 now 11.34 
18.00 now 12.00 
20.00 noW 13.34 
22.00 now 14.67 
24.00 now 16.00 

Big Buy 

CASUAL 
SLACKS 
Double Knit 

Reg. 6.99 
Reg. 7.99 
Reg. 8.99 
Reg. 9.99 

Reg. 11.99 now 8.00 
Reg. 12.99 now 8.67 
Reg. 14.99 now 10.00 

Men's Winter 

Vests & Jackets 

1/3  Off 
Men's Ties 

1/3  Off 
Men's Leisure 

Suits $2900 
One Group Men's 

Shirts $200 

Men's Sport Shirts 

• Knit • Perma Press • Long Sleeve 
Now 1/3  Off 

now only 4.67 
now only 5.34 
now only 6.00 
now only 6.67  

A Few Men's 

- • Suits 
Left to Clear 

89.99 now 49.99 
69.99 now 39.99 

Long Shirt Tails 

19.99 now 15.99 • 
18.99 now 15.20 
17.99 now 14.40 
15.99 now 12.80 99 
14.99 now 12.00 98  
13.99 now 11.20 89  

79 
12.99 now 10.40 59 
10.99 now 8.80 54 
9.99 now 8.00  49 

All Men's Western Sale! 
Men's, & Ladies 

Cowboy 
Boots 

*Tony Lama 

Cowtown Justin 

Texas Brand 

20% Off 
.99 Now 79.99 
.99 Now 79.20 
.99 Now 72.00 
.99 Now 64.00 
.99 Now 48.00 
.99 Now 44.00 
.99 Now 40.00 



Stereo 
8 Track 

77c 
Each 

Boys and Mens 

TUBE SOCKS 
75% Orlon Acrylic 

25% Stretch Nylon 

2Prs. For 

Rence 

S 
Golden T 

Mens 

CUTTING r 
3 Mens Briefs or T-Shirts 

BOARDS Package of 3 

UNDERWEAR 
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JERSEY PRINTS 
Short 

Lengths 	 Yards For 
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MOP & 
GLOW 

32 Oz. Size 

$ 17 

DEPEND-0 

•1 	 • 

TOILET TISSUE 
Golden T 8 Roll Size 

0 0.;  
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HANGING PLANTER POTS 
Decorator 

Reg. '399 	77 
Now 

300 Count Size 

COSMETIC PUFFS 

2 For 1 

POTTY CHAIR 

ADJUSTABLE IRONING 
BOARD TABLE 

MIXED NUTS 
Tom Scott 

12 Oz. Can 
Reg. 5147  Now 

IRONING BOARD 
PAD & COVER SET 

TAPE 
CASE 

$499 

13 Oz. 
Size 

Limit 2 

DIAMOND 
FOIL 
25 Sq. Ft. 

3Fors 
imar=1111M-- 

DRAIN 
POWER 

Drain Opener 
No Lye or Acid 

$ 27 

WILD BIRD SEED OR SUNFLOWER SEED 
5 Lb. Size 

piftfORy 	IYour Choice 

it food 	v I 

CLOROX II 
All Fabric Bleach 

GOLDEN T 
GLASS 

CLEANER 
With Ammonia 15% 

G. T. Daytime 

DISPOSABLE 
DIAPERS 

2For$3 

BOOTIES Mens Permanent Press 

DRESS SHIRTS 
65% Polyester, 35% Cotton 

Reg. '3" 3  50 
Now 	For 

$7  

BED PILLOWS 
Synthetic Fiber Content 

 

11 Oz. Size 
A tDiiiiia; 

 

 

:Altar 

 

 

'MINE . 

 

  

PAM 

 

	Keeps Food From Sticking 
1111111E=IIIM 
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MUSLIN 
100% Cotton 
Unbleached 2Yards For 

ALL REMNANTS 

1/ 2  PRICE 
Special Selection of 

PREFERRED PRINTS, CARNALY PRINTS 
& I LIKE YOU PRINTS 

2Yards For 

Toilet Cleaner 
and Deodorizer 66c 12 Oz. Size 

TAMPAX 
40's Regular or Super 

$127 
1111111E=ZIOMI 

rows. LISTERINE 
20 Oz. Size 

99 
Aqua Net 

HAIR SPRAY 
13 Oz. Size 

c*Ir. 

112 S. Bdwy 	Phone 6474440 	Dimmitt, Texas 

Stor., Hours: Mon. - Fri. 8:30 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. Sat. 8:30 a.m. to 9:00 p.m. 
PRICES GOOD THRU JANUARY 24 
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