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. this young man contemplates his dive.. . 

AAAHHH, RELIEF .. . 
. it wasn't so bad, after all. 

CAN 1 THINK ABOUT THIS A LITTLE MORE? 
• is what he seems to say.. 
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Amstar to add new product 

-- Approved the motion by 
Collins to accept in principal, 
but not in monitary support, 
the nation-wide Peace 
through Strength resolution. 

—Requested that Brown, 
Graham & Co. return in two 
weeks after aldermen have 
had ample opportunity to 
review the prepared annual 
audit report. 

Koeninger gets 
Sundown post 

Williams said, adding, "I 
don't want to hurt the city. 
Really I don't." 

Lapins' motion that the 
request be denied carried 4-1, 
with Lilley opposed. 

In other action, the city 
board: 

—Decided to challenge the 
Census Bureau's preliminary 
population figure for Dimmitt 
of 4,836. 

—Reviewed a report by 
City Manager Garnett Hol-
land and city personnel con-
cerning the new trash collec-
tion fees and possible 
solutions to bring the fees in 
line for various businesses 
sharing one container. The 
discussion was tabled until 
the July 21 meeting, when 
further information will be 
presented. 

—Learned that the amount 
of Revenue Sharing received 
for the period from September 
1979 through October 1980 
may be cut back by as much 
as $10,899. Firm information 
will not be available until 
Congress takes action in 
October on the renewal 
proposal put before it by the 
Office of Revenue Sharing in 
Washington, D.C. 

—Accepted the resignation 
of Juanita Welch, who is 
moving from Dimmitt. 

Dowden Koeniger, Dimmitt 
High School counselor for the 
past four years, has accepted 
a position as principal of the 
Sundown elementary school. 

Koeniger, who has been 
principal at Springlake-Earth 
High School and Wilson 
Elementary, officially began 
his duties at the class B 
school July 1. 

Koeniger said he wanted to 
get back into administration. 

"We've enjoyed the four 
years here and we think the 
kids are great," he said. 

The Dimmitt School Board 
is still accepting applications 
for the vacant counselor's 
spot, according to Supt. 
Robert Ryan. 

ONION HARVEST UNDERWAY—Local 
vegetable processing plants began shipping 
onions this week and managers at LaMantia, 
Collum Collier and Co. of Dimmitt, Inc. and 

Dimco say quality is "excellent" so far. 
Neither plant has had any labor problems and 
harvest is expected to continue through 
mid•August. 

The Amstar Corp. is 
launching a multimillion-
dollar construction project at 
its Dimmitt plant this week 
that will add a new-generation 
liquid sweetener to its line of 
products in 1982. 

The plant's No. 1 refinery—
which has been shut down for 
2'2 years—will be rebuilt and 
modified to produce 55% high 
fructose corn syrup. Amstar 
officials say they already have 
a firm market for the new 
product in the soft-drink 
industry. 

This will be the second 
major remodeling of the 
Dimmitt Amstar Plant. 
Originally designed to pro-
duce mostly corn starch plus 
some syrups, the plant was 
expanded in 1976-77 to pro-
duce 42% high fructose corn 
syrup (HFCS). The liquid 
sweetener, used mainly by 
bottlers and canning compan-
ies, now accounts for two-
thirds of the plant's produc-
tion. 

Addition of 55% HFCS to 
the plant's line of products 
not only will reactivate the 

No. I refinery. It will also 
add eight to 10 more workers 
to the payroll, and will 
increase the plant's grind by 
more than 1% million bushels 
a year, according to Doug 
Lapins, general manager. 

The plant is capable of 
grinding 30,000 bushels of 
corn per day, but has been 
averaging 23-24,000 bushels, 
Lapins said, "mainly because 
of the seasonality of the fruc-
tose demand." 

"We think we'll gain 4,000 
to 5,000 bushels per day in 
the utilization of our grinding 
capabilities," Lapins said. 

The big modification project 
will be engineered by Mitsu-
bishi Chemical Industries, 
Ltd., which designs and 
operates 	high-technology 
refineries in Japan. 

"Their engineers will be 
coming in starting this week 
to survey our No. 1 refinery," 
Lapins said. 	"One of the 
things they'll do is 'size' the 
old refinery and see how 
much of our old equipment 
can be utilized, and what its 

[See AMSTAR, Page 7] 

Controversial insecticide 
approved for spider mites 

Woman, son killed 
in car-truck wreck 

Aldermen challenge 
city's census figure 

Marcus Box of Amarillo, jack-
knifed and overturned after 
Box missed the turn from FM 
2942 onto Hwy. 385 and 
locked the truck's brakes. 

Only one lane of the high-
way was open for two hours 
following the mishap. 

Mrs. Guajardo died at 7:55 
a.m. at Deaf Smith General 
Hospital. Her infant son was 
transferred to Northwest 
Texas Hospital in Amarillo 
and died at 9:45 a.m. 

Richard Guajardo was 
treated and later released for 
injuries sustained in the 
accident, as was the driver of 
the truck. 

A Hereford woman and her 
six-week-old son died Thurs-
day from injuries sustained in 
a car-truck accident which 
occurred earlier that morning 
at 6:10 at the intersection of 
Hwy. 385 and FM 2942 south 
of Hereford. 

Killed were Frances 
Guajardo, 26, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Florencil Vasquez of 
Dimmit, and her son Seth. 

The car driven by Mrs. 
Guajardo's husband Richard 
was southbound on Hwy. 385 
when it collided with a truck 
that had jackknifed just ten 
minutes earlier at the inter-
section. The truck, driven by 

Azdrin, an insecticide once 
prohibited for use on corn 
with spider mites, has been 
temporarily cleared for 
"emergency use only" as of 
last week. 

The chemical was previous-
ly restricted because of the 
possibility of carcinogenic 
residues and its toxicity to 
bees and birds. Shell Chem-
ical Co. has been working for 
two years on the research of 
the chemical, and found that 
the residues are very low level 

and do not remain long. 
"There will be about a 90% 

usage in our area because of 
the emergency situation. The 
most widespread use will be 
from July 10 to August 10," 
said County Entomologist 
Olan Moore. 

The label on the chemical 
restricts usage to 60 days 
before harvest, not to be used 
on silage or ensilage corn, 
and it cannot be used on corn 
that will be grazed. 

"Carl King was very instru- 

mental to the clearance of the 
Azdrin, and he employed the 
help of Texas Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagan Brown 
and Congressman Kent 
Hance," Moore said. 

King and the Texas Corn 
Growers Association have 
been working with Shell 
Chemical Co. for two years 
trying to get the insecticide 
cleared for use. The Environ-
mental Protection Agency 
studied the results of the 
testing and ruled in favor of 
the usage of Azdrin. 

report. 
Edwards phoned the U.S. 

Census District Office in 
Amarillo Tuesday, challeng-
ing the preliminary working 
population figure. 

District Office Manager 
William Soule told Edwards 
the working figure is low 
because some people failed tc 
respond and the intentional 
reluctance of some people 

[See ALDERMEN, Page 7] 

County Fair 
will finalize 

Weatka NHS principal 
hurt in fall 

committee 
plans 

Dimmitt's aldermen plan to 
challenge the Census 
Bureau's preliminary popula-
tion figure for Dimmitt of 
4836. 

The city board learned 
Monday night that they have 
10 days to contest the figures 
given on the census report 
which was received earlier the 
same day. The population 
figures are used to determine 
part of the funding Dimmitt 
receives through tax revenue 
sharing and to determine eli-
gibility on grants and loans. 

City attorney Jack Edwards 
told the board that he had 
tried to mathematically find 
the same total of residents 
using the Census Bureau 
figures and their percentages, 
but he was unable to substan-
tiate their total of 4836 
people. 

"I think they are between 
250 to 2,000 short," Edwards 
said. 

Alderman Fred Annen 
requested that Edwards take 
proper action in contesting 
the figures of the census 

[Readings recorded at 7 
a.m. daily for the preceding 
24 hours.] 

Hi Lo 
Thursday 	 102 	66 
Friday 	 102 	' 	67 
Saturday 	 100 	60 
Sunday 	 96 	61 
Monday 	 95 	64 
Tuesday 	96 	65 
Wednesday 	 98 	67 
July Moisture 	 0.00 
1980 Moisture 	 6  58 

KDHN RADIO 
US Weather Observer 

The Dimmitt Board of 
Aldermen Monday night 
revised a city ordinance to 
allow the sale of beer and 
wine on Sundays in Precinct 
4, but the board refused the 
request from Ken Williams to 
permit private clubs in the 
city to extend their closing 
time from midnight to 2 a.m. 

Two weeks ago, aldermen 
heard requests from Thomas 
Falcon and Jim Butler to 
repeal the city ordinance that 
prohibits the Sunday sale of 
beer and wine. However, the 
aldermen tabled the request 
until Monday's meeting to 
allow time for discussion with 
county officials. 

The County Commissioners 
Court learned in the mean-
time that it had no jurisdiction 
over the Sunday sales. The 
Alcoholic Beverage Commis-
sion allows Sunday sales with-
in the state as long as the 
beer and wine are in a 
separate building or have a 
separate entrance away from 
other liquor. 

Until about six months ago 
when two businesses just out-
side of Dimmitt city limits 
began Sunday sales, the 
businesses had a "gentle-
men's agreement" to close on 
Sundays. 

"The only difference now is 
that everybody isn't playing 
by the same rules," Alder-' 
man Doug Lapins said, 
adding, "Why should people 
within the city limits be more 
restricted than those outside 
the limits?' 

Butler and John King of 
California told aldermen that 
the change in the ordinance 
would not greatly affect the 
general public since beer and 
wine is available close by. 

"They go where they have 
to go for their refreshments," 
King said. 

The motion by Alderman 
Joe Josselet "to leave the city 
ordinance like it is" drew two 
votes. 

Then Alderman Roy Lilley 
moved "that we change the 
ordinance whereby beer and 
wine can be sold on Sunday," 
and his motion carried 3-2, 
with Josselet and Wayne 
Collins voting against it. 

Williams, owner and 
manager of the Colonial 
Supper Club, wanted to 
extend closing time from 12 
midnight to 2 a.m. To do so, 
he must have the city alder-
men change an existing 
ordinance and he must 
acquire a "late hour permit" 
costing $500 per year. 

The board learned that a 
revision of the city ordinance 
would not only allow all 
private clubs to remain open 
the extra two hours, but 
would also allow alcoholic 
beverage consumption any-
where in the city after 12:15 
a.m. week nights and after 
1:15 a.m. Saturday nights. 

"I close on Sundays, — 

Dimmitt Agri Industries asks 
$1 .3 million in attorney fees 

1973. 
DAI's attorneys are now 

seeking the $1.3 million to 
cover the time spent on the 
case and expenses incurred in 
its preparation. Nearly 5,000 
hours of work went into the 
preparation of the case. 

DAI used two different 
legal firms to represent it in 
the case, a Hereford based 
firm and a San Francisco firm, 
The defense argues that since 

Dimmitt Agri Industries' 
attorneys returned to the US 
District Court last Thursday to 
ask that the Corn Products 
Corporation (CPC) pay more 
than $1.3 million in attorneys 
fees. 

The court ruled in May that 
DAI was entitled to $1.5 
million as a result of CPC 
actions that forced the 
farmers cooperative corn-
starch plant out of business in 

hibits can be set up Thursday, 
Sept. 4 after 3 p.m. or early 
Friday, Sept. 5. 

Building materials for the 
booths will not be furnished, 
according to Mrs. Golden, but 
tables will he provided. 

Out of 25 indoor booth 
spaces, there are only six left, 
Mrs. Golden said. 

Entries are now being 
accepted for the Fair Days 
Queen who will reign over fair 
activities instead of the Rodeo 
Queen chosen in the past. 

All civic clubs, organiza-
tions and individual business 
persons can sponsor a candid-
ate for a $25 entry fee .  

The queen and her court 
will be featured in the down-
town parade, and she will be 
crowned prior to the parade. 

Entry deadline is Sept. 1 
and entries are being 
accepted by Luan Ebeling at 
647-4197. 

The Queen will be chosen 
by an out-of-town judge, Mrs. 
Ebeling said. 

The Queen Contest is 
sponsored by the Dimmitt 
Rodeo Association. 

DAI had two legal firms there 
was an "unavoidable duplica-
tion of effort" for which CPC 
should not be held account-
able. 

"She [Judge Mary Lou 
Robinson) has not ruled yet, 
although it could be any time 
now. It's one of those things 
that could take hours or days, 
but we haven't heard from 
her," said DAI general 
manager Billy Clark. 

The Castro County Fair 
Committee will meet Tuesday 
at 9:30 a.m. in the community 
room of the courthouse to 
finalize plans for the 1980 fair 
scheduled for Sept. 4-6 in the 
county exposition building. 

This year's fair will feature 
a parade, old settler's 
reunion, Castro County Rodeo 
and carnival. 

County residents will 
compete in baking, clothing, 
canned fruits and vegetables, 
crafts, horticulture, farm 
products, garden products 
and photography categories. 

Booth space for exhibits in 
the exposition building can be 
rented by contacting Delores 
Golden at the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce office. 

Cost for an eight foot by 12 
foot space is $15 for commer- 
cial exhibits. 	Non-profit 
organizations will not he 
charged for booth space. 

Large outdoor areas are 
available for $25 to commer-
cial exhibitors. 

Booths will be open from 9 
a.m. to 6 p.m. Friday, Sept. 
5. and Saturday, Sept. 6. Ex- 

A Dimmitt man was injured 
Monday afternoon in Nazar-
eth after he fell 35 feet from 
the roof of the Nazareth High 
School gym. 

Jim Peggram was assisting, 
in the final waterproofing of 
the gymiroof when he slipped. 

He was taken to Plains 
Memorial Hospital, X-rayed 
and then transferred to North-
west Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo. Peggram's left 
ankle was crushed and his 
right ankle was sprained in 
the fall. 

He was listed in satisfactory 
condition after surgery 
Monday, where three 
permanent pins were placed 
in his ankle. 

"He is in good shape, still 
bruised and skinned up a bit, 
but that's good for a 35 foot 
fall," said Nazareth school 
superintendent Johnny 
Mason. "He will be in the 
hospital for about a week. 
then into a wheelchair and on 
crutches." 

Peggrarn is the principal at 
Nazareth High School. 

ROCKET'S RED GLARE—Dimmitt's skyline was lit with reds, 
blues and greens Friday night when residents celebrated July 4 
with the traditional lighting of fireworks. Guests at the Sunset 
Circle block party enjoyed this colorful ten shot ground flare. 
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Shelly's Chatter.  

Tom eso attend wedding tn Albuquerque 
Attending were Mrs. Pauline 
Merritt of Oklahoma City and 
a nephew, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles W. Dintrean of Still-
water, Okla. 

Other relatives there were 
sister Aurie W. Cross of 
Clinton, Okla. and children 
Mr. and Mrs. Cullen Butler; 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Smith, 
both of Mesa, Ariz; Mr. and 
Mrs. Clint Price of Salt Lake 
City. Utah; Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Butler of Clovis and Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Butler of 
Dimmitt. Also there were 
grandchildren Mr. and Mrs. 
John King of Lafayette, 
Calif. and great granddaugh-
ter Jennie, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dave Germain of Salt Lake 
City, Jim Butler of Dimmitt, 
Mrs. Jan Sartian and great 
grandson Dave of Brownfield. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Rials 
were at the Butler reception. 
She tells me they had a 
wedding anniversary last 
week and their guests, among 
others, were Joe and Louise 
Scarbrough of Anton. Louise 
is the sister of H.B. Rials. 

Velma Woodburn of Ros-
well and Odie Mundell were 

[See CHATTER, Page 9] 

J. B. Noland and Edwin 
Ramey will leave Lubbock 
Saturday by jet for Corpus 
Christi then by car to Beeville 
where they will install officers 
into the Masonic Lodge. They 
plan a short visit with Edwin's 
grandson Ramey Beene and 
his Mrs. B. and will try to see 
Bascom and Pennye Nelson at 
Beeville. 	They'll be home 
Sunday night. 

Many people came from far 
and near for the two anniver-
sary receptions Sunday. The 
NI. A. McRees 50th was 
hosted by their children. I 
visited that party with Linden 
and Lura Scarbrough, John 
and Juanita Vaclav of 
Amarillo and Glenn Mundell 
and his wife and Joy Ruth 
Chadwick. 	I knew these 
people as young ones at 
Flagg. Also talked with 
Brooke Rogers, a nephew of 
Mac McRee, he lived in Hart 
from 1931-1946, now in 
Amarillo. His friend Hazel 
Austin was there. 

Walter Weems, a cousin of 
Esther and my friend of long 
ago came from Oklahoma 
City. Sisters of Esther, Mild-
red Carroll of Olustee and 
Wilma Crutchfield of Amarillo 
and a niece and husband Mr. 
and Mrs. D. C. Williams of 
Las Vegas were there. Esther 
McRee said her good 
neighbors Mary Cluck, 
Augusta Farris, Millicent 
Davis and Mona Merritt 
brought supper in for all those 
kinfolks and friends. Lovely 
folks, her neighbors. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Butler 
were greeting friends and 
relatives from all over the 
country for their 74th. 

family last Friday, former 
Dimmitt residents now on a 
ranch at McCamey. Ed and 
Johnnie and son Feller and 
John and son James and wife 
Susan. Also there were 
daughter Victor Jean Robbin 
and two children Bonnie Jean 
and Stuart. She is a friend of 
Susan Wise. The Hughs' 
were en route to Colorado for 
a family reunion. 

Last Tuesday Frank and 
Shirley and son Kyle and 
daughter Susan went to Rock-
wood near Brady for the 
funeral service of Frank's 
uncle, Evan Wise. 

The hostesses say you are 
invited to come to the home of 
Mrs. Goldman Dyer, Satur-
day morning from 10 to noon 
for coffee and a bridal shower 
for Sue Rita King. She will be 
married soon to Layne Myatt. 
Sue Rita is the daughter of 
Gene and Mary Nell King. 
Layne is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. H. Myatt. 

Dr. Bob and Paula Bradford 
and Jamie have been here 
from Orange, Tex. for a visit 
with the parents James and 
Mildred and Kent and Mary 
Jo Birdwell, grandmothers 
Josie Bradford and Mamie 
Birdwell. The Bob Bradfords 
and Jack and Susie and baby 
went up to the mountains in 
New Mexico by mobile home. 
They plan to see the Grand 
Canyon and other scenic 
spots. 

* 
Mrs. C. W. or Elisabeth 

Bridgers is here from Hope, 
Ark. for a few days visit with 
daughters Beth and Bob 
Jones and son Craig. Daugh-
ter Mary is at Abilene college. 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 

300 West Bedford 

Ph. 647-4464 	Dimmitt, TX 

friend Flo Nichols from Tulia, 
she felt like bragging on her 
eleven-year-old 	grandson 
John Nichols, son of Jack. 
John along with the grandpa 
and Flo, will be attending the 
Texas Amateur Athletics, I 
guess at Arlington. The 
clipping says that John 2nd 
breaks a state record and 
said he had a superlative 
performance in this age 
group. Swimming in the 200 
meter butterfly, his time was 
2:29.58. Thanks Flo for the 
letter. 

Floyd and Nell Copeland 
are going back to Ruidoso 
when they get the house's 
roof replaced. She thinks it 
will be cooler there, maybe 
so. 

Bill and Kathryn Birdwell 
and son Jim and his dog 
Dusty went by camper car to 
Cowles, N.M., in the Santa Fe 
area for a vacation trip. Did 
much hiking in the wilderness 
area, also the cookouts of 
good food. 

Opal Bearden was hostess 
at a party Friday at the Senior 
Citizens Center with bridge as 
the game, Jessie Silva and 
girls served that good chicken 
and dumplings with sweet 
potato pie to many people 
besides the party group. 
They were Johnnie Vannoy, 
high score, Retta Cluck, 
second high and Tina 
Rawlings, close. Also there 
were Ruth Coleman, Josie 
Bradford. Myrtle and Betty 
Cartwright. Johnnie Vannoy 
moved here recently from San 
Antonio and is a sister of Alva 
Tisdale. 

Frank and Shirley Wise 
were hosts to the Hughs 

.ILE SHEFFY 	saying "I'm Mad Too, 
Elzit and Serena Teague Eddie," a TV personality 

went to Albuquerque last thing. He gave me one of 
week on a Saturday for the them. The Justices visited 
wedding of grandson Tommy them awhile back at a family 
Teague, son of Jack and reunion in Florida. They love 
Nancy. The bride is Michele the Justices' neighbors and 
Burnside. The service was at the friendliness here and 
sunset Saturday June 28 in enjoyed Dimmitt's cool 100 
the garden of her parents. degrees instead of their 113 
The home is on the mountain- degrees at Dallas and Fort 
side overlooking the city, a Worth. 
beautiful sight when the city 	Lynna 	and 	Thomas 
lights came on. The newly- McGuire hosted a fourth of 
weds will live at the base in July party at their house 
North Carolina. Tommy is in Friday night. They cooked 
the Air Force. The Teagues hamburgers on the backyard 
came home by Fort Sumner grill and Laura Lapins made 
and visited friends, the Monte her good homemade beans. 
Hamiltons. 	 Connie Nelson made pepper- 

Carolyn Copeland received ment ice cream. Jim Birdwell 
word that she is the grand- was also a guest and the 
mother of a new baby boy group shot rockets and other 
who came last week. 	His pretty fireworks. 
name is Gregory James and 	Mrs. Alva Tisdale had a 
he weighs 8 pounds, 13 house full of company last 
ounces. The other grands live week, her children and kin-
at Unatilla, Fla. Leland Lee is folk, C. C. and Wanda 
the great granddad. 	 Williams and Cindy from 

Abernathy. Dodie Morris of 
Plainview, Billie, Sammy and 
Kyle and Kristi Lytal of Here-
ford and David and Linda and 
Shelly of Wheeler. Also there 
were Rex Burns, Hazel 
Choate of Tatum, N.M., 
Butch and Oleta Tisdale and 
Jake and Peggy Stabul of 
Meade, Kan., Butch and 
Oleta Tisdale and Kindra of 
Hereford. You can meet Alva 
at Parsons Drug Store. 

Rosalie Markley and daugh-
ter Karen visited her father 
G. H. LaPlant in Dumas. He 
is recuperating from recent 
surgery. The ladies went on 
to Gruver to visit a sister 
Evelyn Bradford and family. 

Emily Clingingsmith is 
home from a visit with their 
daughter Rubye Mae and E. 
W. Halford at Fredricksburg. 
You know the Hallfords grow 
those good peaches. Hope 
they have some this year. 

Susie Reeves went to 
Amarillo last week for a few 
day's visit with her mother 
Mrs. Alice Neeley. 

Another new boy baby 
came to live with Brent and 
Beverly Stephens of Groom. 
They were in Dimmitt to visit 
grandparents Gene and Mary 
Smith. The greats are Mr. 
and Mrs. Elbert DeLozier. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Chaney 
and Mrs. Florence Cooper are 
home from Fort Smith, Ark., 
where they attended a 
cousins' family reunion. 
People came from California, 
South Texas, and all around 
the country. 

Sunset Circle residents had 
a big block party Friday, the 
4th, in the evening. Picnic 
food was enjoyed on a vacant 
lot, also fireworks, much visit-
ing. I went out with Don and 
Verbie Nelson, B. M. Nelson, 
Rex Burnham and Lottie 
Bearden. 

We met Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Harmon, no . kin to Bill 
Harman of Harman's Store, 
and their pretty daughter 
D'Anne Harmon, home from 
Tech. Her guests were Shelly 
Rou, her home is Smithville, a 
student of architecture at 
Tech, Lisa Nix, a pre-law 
student, home is Temple and 
their son Greg Harmon of 
Lubbock, also a Tech student. 
I chatted with Supt. Robert 
Ryan and J'Lynn. 

Kenn and Janet Justice 
were there with their 
company from Arlington. 
Janet's brother Ron and Jan 
Murrell and children Steph-
anie and Gregg. Ron works 
for the Western Company, 
oilfield service division and 
has these bumper stickers 

IGLESIA DE CHRISTO 
E. Lee and S.E. Third 

Evangelista — Miguel Zuniga 

Sunday— 
Bibie Study 	 10:00 a.m. 

Morning Worship. 	.11:00 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	600 p.m. 

Wednesday— 

Bible Classes for all 	.7:30 p.m. 

LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ronnie Travis, Pastor 

Phone 647-2300 
Sunday— 

Sunday Schopl.. .. 9:45 a.m. 

Morning Worship. 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	600 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO  p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services .. 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 
309 N.W. Fourth 

Donald Price, Pastor 

Phone 647-3403 

Sunday— , 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Morning Worship. 	11:00 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 

Wednesday Service... 7:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 

5th and Halsell 

Rev. James E. Jones, Pastor 

Phone 647-2651 

Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	6 - 00 p.m. 

Wednesday Service . 7:00 p.m. 

LA ASAMBLEA CRISTIANA 

"Full Gospel" 
S.W. 5th, 807 B. 

Pastor Ruben Velasquez 

Sunday School 	10:00 a.m. 

Sunday Night 	.... 5:00 p.m. 

Wed. Night 	7 . 00 p.m. 

"Train up a child in the way he should go: and when he 
is old, he will not depart from it." Proverbs 22:6 

Ask anyone what his most precious possession is, and he will almost 
invariably say, "My children." The desire for the welfare of our children 
enables its to "move mountains". We \\ill  do anything, give them anything, 

if we think it will help them. 
Andy and Oleda Schu-

macher had some of the 
****************44r family home last weekend. 
* * daughter Charlote Renfro and 
* Phone 647-3239 	* 
* 	 * son Trigg. 	They live in 
* * 	Purcell, Okla. Also Glenn and 
* For Starting Time 	* Dianna of Flagg. They went * 	 * 
* * out to Lawrence Greens for 
* * hamburgers one evening. • Friday & Saturday 4( 	J. B. and Sarah Blackwell * 	  

* 
* 

Lesead of 	

I visited Bob and Suanna Ellis 
* at Boise City, Okla. last week. 

A good party was at the 

VIe, 	f ' i 	
Senior Citizens Center Tues- 
day evening. 42 people were 41 ..t.,epy hoi,o,v 
there for 42 and other games. * 

*; 	 Cake and coffee were served 
* by hostesses Mary Lou 

* 'I( 
* Sunday 	* Frazier and Melba Howell. 
* * Ocie Bolton and Beatrice 
* * Hardy helped them. 
* * 
* CIRCA 	* 	Susie Reeves was hostess at 
* 	 * a party Thursday with bridge 
* CAPULINA 
* * • and dinner at the Senior 
* i Citizens Center. Guests were 

* Emily Clingingsmith, who 

* CARLILE * won high score. Susie came * 	 it 

* 	 3 in second. Others playing 
* * were Betty Cartwright. Oleda 
* * 7heatee * * Schumacher, Cleo Forson, 
* ir Rosalie Markley, Elizabeth 
* Dimmitt, Texas * Huckabay and Myrtle. 
* it 1 received a letter from 

one most The important thing we can do for them, however, is to 
instill in them a love of God, and a desire to 

obey him. The church can help you in this 
endeavor, inspire and strengthen you. 

We invite you to take your family to church 
this week. It may make a 

great difference in the life 
direction taken by your 

children. 

• *-************** 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 

DEL PRIMOJENITO 
East Halsell St. 

Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 

Sunday School.. 	10:00 a.m. 

Sermon .. 	 11:00 a.m. 

Lord's Supper and 

Feet Washing 

The Church is God's appointed agency in this 
world for spreading the knowledge of His love 

for man and of His demand for man to respond 
to thot love by loving his neighbor. Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no govern-

ment or society or way of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so 
dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even 

from o selfish point of view, one should support 

the Church for the sake of the welfare of him-

self ond his family. Beyond that, however, 

every person should uphold and participate in 

the Church because it tells the truth about 

man's life, death ond destiny;  the truth which 

alone will set him free to live as a child of 

God. 

11:30 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	710 p.m. 

Wednesday Services.. 7:30 p.m. Your Need to Contact Us For.... 

• •
 	

•
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Coleman Adv. Ser. 

EXPERT REPAIRS 
ON YOUR 
LPG EQUIPMENT 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 

Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 

Bible Study 	9:45 a.m. 

Morning Worship and 

Lords Supper 	 10:45 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	600 p.m. 

Wednesday— 

Bible Study 	 730 p.m. 

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA MEXICANA 

300 N. E. 7th 

Pastor Van E. Hughes 

Secretaria Sara Salinas 
Tesorero Gabriel Montiel 

Domingo: 
Estudios Bibliocos 	10:00 a.m. 

El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m. 

Miercoles: 

Instruction 	.. 8:00 p.m. 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Howard Ouiett, Pastor 

110 S. W. Third 

Phone 647-4106 or 647-4107 

Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 

Morning Worship 	10:45 a.m. 

MYF,Jr.Hi & Sr. Hi... 5:30 p.m. 

Evening Worship 	6 - 30 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
General Meeting 

WSCS 	  9:30 a.m. 

Choir 	  7:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 

Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 

Sunday School .... . 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 

Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 

Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 

Choir Rehearsal 	810 p.m. 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 

Monte Wike, Pastor 

302 S.E. 2nd 

Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 

Morning Worship.. 	11:00 a.m. 

Christ Ambassadors and 

Children's Church.. . 6:00 p.m. 

Evangelistic Service 	7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service.. 7:30 p.m. 

. 9:30 a.m. 

.10:30 a.m. 

6.00 p.m. 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 

412 NoCrFithUERaCsHt Street 
Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship. 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . 	. 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	. . 7:00 p.m. 
Monday W.M.0 	. 4:30 p.m. 

Tuesday Brotherhood.7:55 p.m. vi  

Prayer Meeting.. 	7:30 p.m. 
Sanctuary Choir. 	Friday  

7'30 p.m.  

We have the materials and skill to give you expert 
service on all of your LPG equipment. You will save 
time, money and trouble by letting us put your LPG 
equipped vehicles and equipment in first class working 
order. 

Because of shortage of materials we are limited on the 
number of LPG conversions we can make. However, 
we will be happy to make your conversions as 
materials become available. 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
10:00 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 

7.30 p.m. 

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 

501 S.E. 3rd—Ph.647-2402 

Pastor, Rev. Kenneth Carroll 

Sunday— 

Sunday School & Morning 

Worship 	 10-11:30 a.m. 

Evening Service 	7.00 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	 7:00 p.m. 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 

Western Circle Drive 

Sunday— 

Church School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Common Worship. 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 

1101 W. Halsell — Ph.647-4219 
Sunday— 

Mass in English... 	7 00 a.m. 

Mass in Spanish 	 10 30 a.m. 

Religion Classes 	 9 30 a.m. 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday— 
Mass 	7 00 

Holy Days— 

Mass in English. 	7 00 ain 
Mass in Spanish. 	8:00 P m. 
Confessions— 
Friday 	700 to 8•00 p.m 

Baptism by Appointment 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 

CHURCH 

Raymond Jones, Pastor 

Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Morning Worship 	 .11:00 a.m 

Training Union 	 6:00 p.m. 

Evening Worship 	7- 00 p.m. 

Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 

Dale Wells, Minister 

Sunday— 

Bible Study 	 
Morning Worship. 

Evening Worship 

Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 

Sunday School 	 

Morning Worship 

Evening Worship 

Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services 	7:30 p.m 

11:00 a.m. 

VARDELL FUELS Published Through the Cooperation of the Local Ministerial Association and Sponsored by the Undersigned Individuals and Business Institutions 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. HAYS IMPLEMENT CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 

DIMMITT TV CABLE 

C&S EQUIPMENT CO 
Highway 86 East 	 Phone 647-3174 SEALE FLORIST 

Ph. 647-3554 

DENNIS FLORAL & GIFTS 
Across From the Hospital 

647.3191 

GOODPASTURE, INC. 
Dimmitt Plant 

FIRST STATE BANK • 
.0. -.ea% dr._ . a - nairaishCilitasill 	' 



s1.59k 
Wilson 

MEAT FRANKS  12  ". Pkg.  79C 
White Swan American 

CHEESE SLICES 	 

VELiftEETA  2 lb. Box 
$249 

12 oz. $149 

Large Green Stalks 

CELERY 
39` 

PLUMS 
69C lb. 

ALL GRINDS 	INSTANT 

$279  $449to oz. 
Jar  

  

Thursday, July 10, 1980 

8/e THESE 

elti alb*  swe/Kr 

pESTEA  4 ez. instant Tee  $  99  

COTTAGE CHEESE  Plains 16 °z.  79' 

	

PINE-SOL 	4° °z. ffie 	$219  
FRU IT DR I N KS  .TGrr:PPmr= Pit  5/$1 

PEANUT BUTTER Jiff 18 oz. 

POTATO CHIPS 	
 

Pringle Twin Pack 994 
CAKE MIX 
CAT CHOW 	 
DOG FOOD 
ORANGE JUICE 
OLIVES 
	

Holsum Stuffed 10 oz. Jar 

Duncan Hanes 

	69c Layer Cake 

Purina 4 lbs. Bag 	 $ 1 99 

Purina Moist 8, Chunky 5 lbs. $1  99  

 

Texsun 46 oz. can 	894  
$119 

DIMMITT 
SUPER MARKET 

103 Belsher Street, Dimmitt Store Hours: 7 a.m. 'til 9 p.m. 

We Give Double Gunn Bros. Stomps On Tuesdays And Wednesday 

Specials Good July 10 Thru July 16, 1980 

Wilson Certified Boneless 

BACON 
Wrights 

Sliced Sl iro Slab c 
/ lb. 

THE CASTRO COUNTY NEWS, DIMMITT, TEXAS 
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DILL PICKLES 	Vlasic 22 oz. 	79 
FLOUR  Gold Medal 5 lbs. 

89c 

with Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

Chicken of Sea 6 1/2  oz. 

TUNA 

29` 

Sweet Yellow 

CRISCO OIL  48 ez.  Bettie 	$ 2 19  

EAGLE BRAND MILK 	 13 oz. 	87' 
LEMONADE CRYSTALS  Real Lemon 30 oz. $229  

FACIAL TISSUE  Waldorf 175 Ct.B"   3 Is 1 
TOILET TISSUE  4-Roll Nice-N-Soft 894 

REFRIED BEANS  16 oz Old El Paso  3/$1 
MARGARINE  Parkay 1 lb Sticks 2/$1 

Luncheon Loaf 12 oz. can $117 

 

AJAX 	 Giant Cleanser 21 oz. 	2/$1 
TUNA 	

Chicken-of-Sea 61/: oz. 	87  
GRAPE JELLY Boma 32 oz. 99'  

MAXWELL HOUSE 
COFFEE 

CAULIFLOWER 
59` each  

)7 

SPAM 

Santa Rosa Ripe and Sweet 

1 lb. 
with Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 	 Con 

ONIONS 19` lb 

DOUBLE BARRELED 
SPECIALS 

WITH FILLED GUNN BROS. 
STAMP BOOKLET 

Gold Medal 5 lbs. 

FLOUR 

29C 

Large White Heads 

with Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

PALMOLIVE 
LIQUID 

22 oz. 29` 
with Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

Nice-N-Soft 4-Roll 

TOILET TISSUE 

29` 



USTICB 

Justice Real Estate 
Virgil Justice. 647-2159 	Kenn Justice, 647-5512 	Cliff Lewis, 647-2454 

647.4101 	 115 West Bedford 

Home Listings 
810 WEST ETTER - 3-bedroom home with one bath, garage. 
Carpeted. Very nice inside. Call for appointment. 

SOUTHWEST DIMMITT - Brick 3-bedroom, 2-bath home with 2-car 
garage. Fenced yard. Lovely home with lots of room. Call for 
appointment. 

Home and 6 Acres - 	 ho 	1 3/4  bath, 2-car garage, 
basement, in city li 	 .X30-ft. barn and corral, 
joins city limits. Cal 	nt 

Farm Listings 
CASTRO COUNTY 

2 Half Sections dry land. 

Section north of Easter, 5 wells with tile. 

1,000 Acres near Easter, 5 wells, one lake pump, with tile. 

2 Sections north of Tam Anne, 7 wells, two lake pumps, lots of tile. 

160 Acres - Dodd/Lazbuddie area, strong water and underground 

pipe. 

Half-section - Good water, 2 wells, 2 pivot sprinklers. Dodd area. 

306 acres-North of Dimmitt, nice home, and improvements, 4 wells 
with return system, low down payment, possible loan assumption. 

300 Acres - West of Dimmitt on highway, 2 good 8" wells, lots of 
underground tile, lays excellent, 4.7 million-pound storage, with dryer 

and scales. 

160 ACRES - southwest of Easter. Good six-inch well. 

EAST PARMER COUNTY 

Half Section - One circle irrigated, rest in grass. 

Half Section - 2 very strong 8" wells, lays good and has tile. 

Half Section - One strong 8" well and one extremely good return 
system. 

Due to the success of 
our recent Hail Sale. we 
have  a  gorod selection of 

PRE-OWNED 
PICKUPS 

'77 FORD 
F-150 Super Cab 
with air '2995 
'77 CHEVROLET 
Scottsdale half-ton 
with air 	 '2895 

'2495 '77 FORD 
5C1 

77 COURIER 	52 1 50 

76 FORD 
F-150 4x4 	S2250 

'75 FORD 
Ranger F-250 
Super Cab.  

'74 FORD 
Ranger half-ton 
With air 

'74 CHEVROLET 
nall-ton with air 

'2695 

	9695 

'1695 
74 DATSUN 	51795 

Stan Byrnes 
Ford, Inc. 

N. Hwy. 385 	647-2115 
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GO CIASSIMS  
****************** 
* 	 * 
* We have many qualified 1E 

* 
4( 	 4( 

buyers for farms. Your * 
* listings appreciated. 
it 	 * 
* - 	 * 
it 	 it 

* 
* Two Story. 	Custom * 
* built one owner home. 
* Four bedrooms, three * 
*  * baths, formal living and 
* dining room. Fireplace, * 
* * double self-cleaning ; 
* oven, built-in china cab- * 
* * * i net and bookcase, * 
it beamed ceiling in den. * 
* i  * Extra insulation n 
* walls. 	Circular drive. * 
* * Apprx. 2600 sq. feet of ; 
* luxury. 	 * 
* It 
* * 

1S-LEGAL NOTICES 8-SERVICES 6-AUTOMOTIVE 3-FOR SALE, MISC. The Castro County News 1-REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND 647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 "WE SELL SLEEP" DIRECT 

MATTRESS CO., Mattresses 
Renovated, New Mattresses 
and Box Springs, Water Beds, 
any size. For appointment, call 
Running M Boot Shop. 647- 
4264. 	 8-20-tfc 

FOR SALE: 1974 one-ton 
Dodge with stake bed. The 
Surplus Store, 121 SE 2nd. 

6-33-tfc 

THERMOPHORE (the auto-
matic moist heat pack) by 
Battle Creek now available at 
Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tfc 

HOMEMADE GIFTS for all' 
occasions-bridal showers, ba-
by showers. Quilts and baby 
quilts. Senior Citizens Center. 
Jones and SW Third, 647-2654. 

3-39-tfc 

Published each Thursday in Dimmitt, Texas, by the News 
Publishing Co., 108 W. Bedford, Second Class Postage Paid at 
Dimmitt, Texas, Publication Number 092980 

LEGAL NOTICE 
Notice is hereby 

given that THOMAS 
AVILA FALCON has 
filed an application for 
a wine only package 
store permit with the 
Texas Alcoholic Bever-
age Commission in 
Austin, Travis County, 
Texas, the substance 
of such application 
being as follows: 

Type of License or 
Permit 	Wine Only 
Package Store Permit 

Location of Business 
- 103 S.E. 3rd Street, 
Dimmitt, Castro 
County, Texas 

Name of Owner 
Thomas Avila Falcon 

Name of Firm -
Falcon's Beer & Wine 

FOR SALE: Pickup Topper, 
Paneled inside. Ph. 647-2448. 

6-39-tfc 

PUBLISHER'S NOTICE: 
All real estate advertised in 
this newspaper is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968, which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference. 
limitation, or discrimination 
based on race, color, religion. 
sex, or national origin, or an 
intention to make any such pre-
ference, limitation, or discrim-
ination." 
This newspaper will not know-
ingly accept any advertising for 
real estate which is in violation 
of the law. Our readers are 
informed that dwellings adver-
tising in this newspaper are 
available on an equal oppor- 
tunity basis. 	1-28-tfc 

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press 
Association, Panhandle Press Association and National News-
paper Association. 

INSULATION - Homes and 
steel buildings. Call Air-Tite 
Insulation Co. or see Robert 
Daniel, 647-2372. 	8-3-tfc 

REPAIR OF ALL brands of 
major appliances. Dimmitt Ap-
pliance Center. Jim Hrabal. 
647-5690. 	 8-7-tfc 

25r( SAVINGS on State Farm 
Homeowner Insurance!!!!SEE 
how much you may save by 
insuring your HOME, CAR, 
LIFE and HEALTH with KENT 
BIRDWELL INSURANCE. 116 
E. Jones St., Dimmitt, Texas, 
647-3427. 	 8 3 tfc 

LET US make you an estimate 
on Targonal bath and kitchen 
floors and walls. TROY KIRBY, 
647-5351. 	 8-37-tfc 

McKIBBEN ROOFING: All 
types of roofing and fencing. 
17 years experience. Ph. 364-
6578 or 364-8095, Hereford. 

8-29-tfc 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Year, S9.00 	School Year, $7.50 	Six Months, $5.50 

7- BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES WOMAN'S World Boutique 

features attractive women' 	 
clothing, sizes 4 through 12, 
12'74 through 50. 	Dorcelle 
leather purses, snoopy dolls, 
Karen's musical clowns. 
Located by Caison's Bar-B-
Que in Hereford. Phone 806-
364-1350. 

3-36-tfc 
REDUCE safe & fast with 
GoBese Tablets & E-Vap 
"water pills" Parson Rexall 
Drug 	 3-40-3tp 
FOR SALE: Whirlpool Ice-
maker, 100 pounds per day. 
Ph. 647-4547 	3-37-tfc 

MERLITE JEWELRY SPRING 
BAZAAR: Buy one, get one 
FREE through July 12. Randy 
Gilliland, 613 NW 6th, Ph. 
647-2448. 	 3-39-3tc 

USED BOOKS - Cheap; all 
kinds - paperbacks, etc. Call 
Brick 647-3532 Tues. thru Sat. 

3-41-Re 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	  Tuesday Noon 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 	 Monday, 10 A.M. 
Sports, Society, Church News 	  Monday Noon 
Community Correspondence 	  Monday Noon 
Personal Items 	 Monday, 5 P.M. 
General News, City and County 	  Tuesday Noon 

WE CAN HELP you with your 
payroll, daily posting, monthly 
statements, financial state-
ments, employer, sales and 
income tax. SHEFFY OFFICE 
SERVICES, INC., 130 East 5th, 
364-0276-Hereford 	7-37-tfc * Enjoy this 3-bedroom 

* • with 13/4  bath, living 
* room and den, central 
• heat and air, humidifier, 
It Situated on three lots 

* relocating. 
it 

• NEW LISTING: 
* A new metal building, 
* • 40 by 45, situated on 
* 100' by 300' lot, owner 
* • 'moving. priced to sell. 

a 
14-CARD OF THANKS 8-SERVICES 12-NOTICES LOTS FOR SALE: Attractive 

Westlawn Memorial Park. 
Contact 647-5534 or 647-5563.  

1-40-tfc 

41  

CARD OF THANKS 	PLAINS MEMORIAL HOSPI- 

I would like to take this TAL School of Vocational Nurs- 
es Training is now taking appli- 
cations for the fall semester. 
Apply at the hospital business 
office. 	 12-24-tfc 

OWNER SELLING: 	3-bed- 
room, P 4-bath home. Central 
air and heat, freshly painted, 
new roof, fenced, single 
garage. 647-3495. 

1-40-tfc 
• 

YARD MOWING- Russell 
Heath, 647-5548. 	8-33-tfc 
RENTAL color TVs. Kittrell 
Electronics. 	 8-51-tfc 
WANT TO BUY: Good used 
evaporative air conditioner or 
refrigerated unit. Call 
647-4445 or 647-5444. 

10-40-tfc 13-LOST & FOUND 

Nice 2 
bedroom home, living 
room, den or third bed- * 
room, 1 bath and gar-
age. 

3-Bedroom Home. Ap-
proximately 1,100 feet, 
well located, new carpet, * 
fenced backyard, 10X20 
ft. 	workshop. 	Owner it 

9-HELP WANTED 
PLUMBING, heating and sewer 
services, electric eel rooter. A-1 
Mechanical, Inc. Ph. 647-3149. 

8-11-tfc 

opportunity to express my 
thanks to all who visited me in 
Plains Memorial Hospital in 
Dimmitt and Methodist Hos-
pital in Lubbock and for the 
cards and flowers and especial-
ly for your prayers. A special 
thanks to Dr. Lee and the 
nursing staff, as well as the 
nurses and doctors in Metho-
dist Hospital. May God bless 
each of you. 

ARLENE HOLBROOKS 
14-41-1te 

LOST: Black white-faced cow 
with E on left shoulder. Call 
Ted or Graham Sheffy. 647- 
3246 of 647-2576. 	13-28-tfc 

FOR SALE: By owner. Maple 
Street. 3 bedroom brick house, 
living room, den, free standing 
fireplace, custom drapes. 
covered patio, double garage. 
Call 647-4228 for appointment. 

1-38-tfc 4-HOUSEHOLD GOODS 

A copy of the appli-
cation for the wine 
only package store 
permit is filed and 
made under oath to the 
Texas Alcoholic Bever-
age Commission in 
Austin, Travis County, 
Texas, with a copy to 
the District Office of 
the Texas Alcoholic 
Beverage Commission 
in Lubbock, Lubbock 
County, Texas, and 
any person desiring to 
contest the facts stated 
in said application and 
the applicant's right to 
secure such permit-
may do so upon giving 
security for costs as 
provided by law. 

15-40-2tc 

Classifieds Gets Results 
FOR SALE: 617 N.W. 7th, 3 
bedroom with garage, equity 
and take over payments or re- 
finance. 647-4580. 	1-19-tfc 

FOR SALE in Hart: Nice house 
with 3 or 4 bedrooms, two 
baths. Central air and heating. 
Approx. 1,850 square feet. 
Basement and' double garage. 
X-tra large back yard with 
fence. Call 938-2252. 

1-30-tfc 

SERVICES: Custom swathing, 
baling & stacking. 	Call 
647-2239. 	 8-40-2tc 

FOR SALE: Stainless steel 
sink with three compartments. 

I Also five bar stools, black vinyl 
I and chrome. 647.2444. 

4-40-4tc 

SPRAYING SERVICE 
Trees • Lawns • Livestock 

Shrubs • Weeds 
Now Is The Time To 

Spray For Bag Worms 

RON-  MITCHELL 
Phone: Home 647-3438 
after 5 and on weekends 

Office 647-4545 

FOR SALE: Large evaporative 
cooler, also 1-room refrigerated 
unit. Ph. 647-4540. 

4-41-tfc 

Your chances 
of dying 

from a heart attack 

or stroke are 50-50. 

T ArnermantileartAw.malion 

FREE NEEDLEWORK 
CLASSES taught in your home. 
Call in Hereford 364-5687. 

8-40-4tp 

WANTED: Nursery keeper for 
Sunday evening and Wednes-
day evening church services. If 
interested, call 647-2300 or 
647-5474. 	 9-41-3tc 

MEDICAL RECORDS SECRE-
TARY-preferably an ART, but 
anyone with knowledge of 
medical terminology will be 
considered. Apply at business 
office, Plains Memorial 
Hospital. 647-2191. 	9-39-tfc 

HELP WANTED: Licensed vo-
cational nurses. South Hills 
Manor Nursing Home. Apply to 
Joyce Adrian, Director of Nur- 
ses, 647-3117. 	9-23-tfc 

5-FARM EQUIPMENT. 

FARMS 
it  • 320 acres. two separate * 
41  parcels: 	160 acres * 
* • located four miles S.E. of * 
* 'Nazareth and 160 acres 4(  
.** located three miles N.E. 
* of Hart. Prefer to sell as * 

a unit. but will consider 
'it selling separately. 

ARE TERMITES and roaches 
your unwanted guests? If so, 
call Plains Pest Control, 
Amarillo, 355-4341. 	8-39-26tp 

McKNIGHT SEWING CEN-
TER, 226 N. Main, Hereford. 
Ph. 364-4051. (Singer Auth-
orized Dealer) For full sales 
and service, parts, labor, new 
and used machines and vacuum 
cleaners. Machines and va-
cuums in Dimmitt, call 647-
2552 before 8 a.m. or after 4 
p.m. and all day Saturday. 	, 

8-49-tfc 

HOT WEATHER is almost on 
us. For repair on evaporative 
coolers, in the shop. home or 
business, • Call The Surplus 
Store, at 647-3623. 	8-33-tfc 

2-FOR RENT FOR DEAD STOCK 
REMOVAL 

CALL YOUR LOCAL 

USED COW DEALER 
Call Toll Free 1-8001?,?a:los 

FOR SALE: 	Four Moline 
Motors. Ph.647-4540. 5-37-tfc 

10-WANTED, MISC. WE REPAIR all makes of fence 
chargers. Dimmitt Consumers 
Electric Shop, NE 3rd & Etter. 

5-16-tfc 

TRAILER SPACE for rent. Call 
Brenda Andrews, 647-2650 or 
647-5463. 	 2-18-tfc 

OFFICE AND BUSINESS space 
for rent. $1 to $3.50 per square 
foot. 121 E. Bedford. 

2-19-tfc 

FOR SALE: Metal Reels, 19" 
X 7". Holds approximately 2 
miles electric fence wire. S4.50 
each. Quantity discounts. 
945-2538 	 5-40-tfc 

GEORGE 
REAL ESTATE 
Hwy. 385 South 

Jimmie R. George 
Broker 

Office 	647-4174 
Danny Rice 647-3552 
Dub George 647-4469 

WE BUY GOOD Used Furni-
ture, The Surplus Store, 121 SE 
2nd. 647-3623. 	10-33-tfc 

I NEED A JOB: Would like to 
learn a trade. Call 647-3284. 

10-41-2tc 
APARTMENT for rent, Coun-
try Arms Apartments, 111 NW 
llth. 647-3318. 	2-23-tfc 

FOR LEASE: 3 bedroom - 2 
bath double wide Mobil. 
Fenced '4 acre. $275.00 plus 
S150.00 deposit. 6 mo. lease. 
647-2295. 	 2-40-tfc 

• YARD CLEANING, mowing, 
rototilling. Call Sam Raper Jr., 
647-4415. 	 8-35-tfc 

FOR YOUR small gas engine 
repair work. Call 647-3362. 

8-32-tfc 

6-AUTOMOTIVE 
* 

• ********** 	42041( 
1f-LIVESTOCK, PETS 

RITCHIE LIVESTOCK Waters 
& Hydrants, heated & constant 
flo. Ph. 364-7190, Hereford. 

11-10-tfc 

3-FOR SALE, MISC. GLASS 
WOULD YOU like a half day 
off each week but are too busy? 
Let SHEFFY OFFICE 
SERVICES do the work. Lanier 
Dictating Equipment. Pick up 
and deliver. 	130 East Fifth, 
364-0276-Hereford. 	3-37-tfc 

• 
TREE SPRAYING, custom tree 
and landscape service. T. J. 
Carter. Tex. lie. PCL-1440pt-
LOW. Amarillo 373-4593, Dim-
mitt representative Leon Gilli-
land 647-2448. 

8-29-tfc 

12- NOTICES 

Large stock of flat glass for 
combine and tractor cabs, etc. 
Wholesale and retail on L-0-F, 
Pittsburgh and Carlite wind-
shield glass. Installed right and 
weather-tight. See Gene at 
Dimmitt Upholstery & Garage, 
214 N. Broadway, 647-2534. 

6-52-tfc 

BOBBY GRIEGO 
DRAGLINE SERVICE 

TAILWATER PIT 
CLEANING 

LOADER DOZER 

IF YOU HAVE too much work 
for one and not enough for two. 
SHEFFY OFFICE SERVICES 
can do your overflow. Plain 
bond copier, 10 cents a copy. 
130 East 5th, 364-0276-Here- 
ford. 	 12-37-tfc 

CUSTOM FARMING. You 
name it, we do it. 	Call 
647-5493. 	 8-26-tfc 

NEW AND USED Furniture, 
Air Compressors, Electrical 
Supplies and Motors. The Sur- 
plus Store. 	 3-33-tfc 

SHAKLEE PRODUCTS. Chris 
Maples, 647-5227. 	3-24-tfc 

Phone 364-2322 
Mobile Phone 375-4541 

8-40-tic 

THE FOLLOWING VEHICLES 
are available at these prices: 
Jeeps. $59.50; Cars, S48; 
Trucks, S89. Call for informa-
tion, 602-941-8060, ext. 503. 

6-33-10tc BEAUTIFUL ANTIQUE brass 
and iron bedstead for sale. 
Completely refinished. Call 
647-4170. 

FOR SALE: 1974 Pinto. Call 
647-4478 after 7 p.m. 

6-40-2tc 

CARPET CLEANING-Profes-
sional service at reasonable 
prices. 24-hour service. Free 
insurance claim estimates. 
Modern Carpet Center, 647- 
3452 or 296-9209. 	8-41-tfc 

ON THE FARM tractor and 
combine air conditioner repair 
and service. JIM'S FARM A/C 
SERVICE, call 647-5310 or 
697-3127. 	 8-20-tfc 

3-30-tfc 

HOME FOR SALE 
Buy equity and assume 
FHA loan at 9%. 3-bed-
rooms, 2 full baths, Built-
in kitchen. Fully car-
peted, Central heat & air. 
Fenced backyard and 
steel siding. 

304 NW 4th 
Between 8 a.m. & 5 p.m. 
Ph. 647-4111 
After 5:30 Ph. 647-3340 

FOR SALE: 1978 Subaru Brat 
four-wheel drive pickup, less 
than 8,600 miles. $3500. Call 
647-3248 	 6-40-2tc 

MERLITE JEWELRY FOR 
SALE: reasonably priced. Ran- 
dy Gilliland, 613 NW 7th, Ph. 
6,17-2448. 	 3-33-tfc 

DIETING? 
Let us show you a way to lose 

weight that is guaranteed, or 
your money back. Phone 806- 
938--2607. 	 8-38-4tc-
SHEFFY OFFICE Services, 
Inc., complete secretarial, 
bookkeeping and tax service. 
Confidential, dependable, 
efficient. 130 East Fifth, 
364-0276-Hereford 	8-37-tfcl 

VEACH & SANDERS ROOF-+" 
ING, Plainview. 	Free esti- 
mates, work guaranteed. Call 
293-5617 or 293-1631. 

8-37-8tp 

NEW AND USED Air Condi-
tioners, The Surplus Store, 121 
SE 2nd. 	 3-33-tfc CASTRO COUNTY, one 

hall section of land, south 
of Dimmitt, located on 
paved road. Best of water 
in this area. Land is near 
perfect with 2 good 8-inch 
wells. 

IRRIGATED FARMS in the 
following counties: Castro, 
Hartley. Lamb, Parmer, 
Potter and Deaf Smith. 

ONE-HALF SECTION, 3 
irrigation 	wells 	tied 
together, 1 return sysiem, 
5-room frame house, Hart 
area. 

ONE SECTION, 4 wells, 
1 1 . mile underground 
pipe. frame house. Easter 
vicinity. 

WILSON 
REAL ESTATE 
FARMS - RANCHES 

RESIDENTIAL & COM- 
MERCIAL PROPERTY 

Office, 647-4487 Dimmitt 
Edd Wilson, Broker 

FASHION TWO TWENTY 
COSMETICS, Lorena Cates. 
407 NW 3rd. 647-4210.3-24-5241 HUCKABAY 

Offers Complete 

Real Estate Serrice: 

✓ New Homes 

V Pre-C ned Homes 

v Custom Contracting 

✓ Loans 

✓ Farm Land 

ve Abstracts 

✓ Title Insurance 

✓ Hazard Insurance 

iluckabay 
Abstract Co. 

647-3519 Business 
647-3356 Home 

105 E. Bedford 
Dimmitt 

IF IT'S TYPEABLE, we can do 
it - Correspondence, mass 
mailings. briefs, narrative 
reports, resumes, statistical 
work, corporate minutes, loan 
and title papers. SHEFFY 
OFFICE SERVICES, INC., 130 
East 5th, 364-0276-Hereford. 

8-37-tfc 

COWSERT 
REAL ESTATE 

106 W. Bedford 
Phone 647-3650 

Night 647-2474 

2-bedroom, double car 
garage. excellent condi- 
tion 

Several other homes 
priced from $19.000 up 

FARMS 

Approximately 40 acres 
joining city limits of Dim-
mitt. Man said bring him 
any reasonable offer. 

80 Acres south of Hub. 
Good 8" well 

WE NEED 
FARM LISTINGS 

Jack Cowsert Broker 

E. B. Noble - Salesman 

STORAGE 
SPACES 

FOR RENT 
DIMMITT STORAGE 

& RENTAL 
Box 729 	647-3447 



Agriculture is still on ter 
Although only about 4 5% of 
the population today work on 
farms. another 25% are 
employed in related In 
dusters.- Food transportation. 
mArting, financing, manu 
lecturing, chemical develop 
mat and textiling are a few 
businesses which push the 
agricultural industry to the 
nation's number one position 
accounting (or nearly 25% of 
the Gross National Product. 
As bad as things have been 
etionomically. Americans still 
spend only about 17 percent of 
their income after taxes for 
food. In a majority of the 
world's countries the amount 
of -income paid for food 
exceeds 40% In just 25 years 
the percentage of disposable 
income spent for food in the 
likited States has decreased 
mote than 28%' Equally as 
dt*Mattc as this decrease is 
Se increase in selection and 
quality of foods available 
last time anybody counted 
there a ere better than 11.000 
toed selections 

HATS 
IMPLEMENT 

i 	CO. 
647-2151 

IEEE OM" D D 

• 

• 

• 
• 

We nave qualified roofers with proven, 
dependable service. 	We use only top 
quality materials, and stand behind our 
work. For a FREE ESTIMATE, just give us 
a call—we're ready to serve you 

Call BOB REED at 938-2183 

Ed Harris Lumber Co. 

looting? 
Siding? 
WE HAVE A 
GOOD SUPPLY "' 

OF CEDAR AND 

COMPOSITION 
SHINGLES 

1st in quality 
1st in savings 

On Doubleknits, Unbleached Muslin, Butter 
Boucle Plains and Preferred Prints...make 
TG&Y the place to shop for your fabric buys! 

FABRIC SHOPS Add a little sun to the savings on these 
fine fabrics and the rays of summertime 

will set on your fashion! items Available In Fabric Shops July 6-12 

Yds1 .00  2 For
.  1.27 3.27 2 27 

The fabric more Rockland Ind.® Save on Abbot® Save 16% on 
women depend quality Muslin fabric to accent preferred fabric 
on than any other! at 15°/o savings fall fashions! from V.I.P.® 

Polyester Doubleknits A wide 
array of 100% Polyester fabric 

Unbleached Muslin Very yet- 
sable and practical Permanent 

Butler 	Boucle 	Plains 	50 ,  
Acetate-50S Nylon fabric lust 

Preferred Prints Stylish 100% 
Cotton prints that will Chen up 

Stretch your imagination and Press Muslin 	Casual but chic right for great looking blouSes any outfit 	Permanent Press. 
your budget while you whip up as fashion tops and dresses dresses, and skirts 	Fashions this fabric will go straight from 
a wardrobe fit for a queen Make them as simple or ornate you'll love' 58160-  wide in bold dryer to closet. bypassing the 
Stock 	up 	now, 	sew 	later as 	your 	taste 	prefers 	Un- colors that accent 	whatever iron' 	Full 	bolts. 44/45" wide .  
Doubleknits are ideal for shorts bleached Muslin is easy to care you wear them with Full bolts Easy care Conon prints will 
and slacks. suits and dresses. for. 100% Cotton 	Full bolts. available at America's favorite 'cute' up your wardrobe Now 
and so much morel Come to 44/45" Also great for curtains fabric store. MO' Shopping is the time to save. and TUN is 
TCSN 	now 	for 	Polyester drapes. tablecloths. and more' with 	us 	is 	the 	first 	step 	tc the place Reg 2 69 YO 
Doubleknits 	al 	big 	savings' Here s 	your chance to buy sewing 	up 	a 	practical 	anci 
58.10' wide, full bolts and save' Reg 1 49 Yd stylish fall wardrobe 

Save 20% To 50% 
on spring and summer fabrics 

T 0 
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Miss Sandoval 
in Air Force 

Judith Sandoval. daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Emigdio 
Sandoval of Dimmitt, recently 
enlisted in the Air Force in 
Clovis, N.M. She will attend 
a six week Basic Military 
Training Course at Lackland 
Air Force Base in San 
Antonio. 

Miss Sandoval, a 1980 
graduate of Dimmitt High 
School, selected the passen-
ger and household goods area 
for job training. 

County cattle 
ranks third 

Zimmatic 
Low Pressure 
waters down 
overhead 

'THANKS, TOMMY'—New Boss Lion Jack 
Edwards (left) presents a president's apprec-
iation plaque to outgoing Boss Lion Tommy 
Fowler during the Dimmitt Lions Club's 
Installation Banquet and Ladies' Night at 

K•Bob's Steak House recently. During the 
banquet. Fowler presented the club with its 
50th Anniversary Patch, and gave milestone 
service pins to several members, including a 
35-year membership pin to E. L. Ivey. 

Former Dimmitt resident 
is awarded doctorate 

MISCELLANEOUS furnish-
ings appear more related to 
one another against warm 
walls than against cool —
warm colors have a unifying 
effect. 

Cutting overhead is one of the keys 
to profitable irrigation With a Zimmatic Low 
Pressure System over your crop you can 
unlock the door to big savings Stan by Cutting 
horsepower requirements by as much as 
One-third and keep saving because your 
System will likely be more efficient and use 
less water .  

And choosing Zimmatic Low Pressure gives 
you more than an economical center plaint.  
You get the company that pioneered low 
pressure in center pivot irrigation Lindsay 
developed Zimmatic Low Pressure to cut 
horsepower without cutting performance Your 
pivot is still 100°. Zimmatic with all the 
dependable features and top-duality material 
that Lindsay is known for 

If you re considering center pivot irrigation 
consider Zimmatic Low Pressure 	the 
pioneer Come in soon and find oul how 
to water down your overhead while you pump 
up your profits 

Castro County ranked 
third in 1979 in number of 
cattle and calves, and cattle 
on feed in Texas, Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown reported recently. 

Of the top ten counties 
Castro maintained 1.5% of 
the total with 197.000 head. 
In the number of cattle on 
feed Castro had 6.5% with 
123,000 yead. 

Total marketing of cattle 
and calves for the state was 7 
billion lbs. earning $4.9 
billion. 

Marketing of cattle on feed 
amounted to 4.4 million head. 
The largest number of cattle 
on feed were marketed in 
January, 1979, with the 
selling of 470,000 head. 

In 1979 there were 157,000 
cattle and 13,000 milk cow 
operations in the state. 

The ten leading counties in 
the number of cattle and 
calves are located in the High 
Plains areas. 

• • 
christian irrigation, inc. 
800 E. 6th 	 Plainview 	 293-4337 HIGH-HEELS too high? 

There's hope for some. Take 
high-heel shoes to a shoe 
repairman to determine if 
heel heights can be lowered 
for comfort and fashion with-
out harming the arch. 

Hereford Office 
364-6400 
Earth Office 
257-3855 

Call Dean Allen 
Box 423 
Olton, TX. 79064 
806-285-2077 

Melody Murphey Belling-
hausen was awarded the 
degree Doctor of Osteopathy 
at commencement exercises 
of the Texas College of 
Osteopathic Medicine May 17 
at the Tarrant County Con-
vention Center in Fort Worth. 

Dr. Bellinghausen grad-
uated from Levelland High 
School in 1970 and from South 
Plains College in 1972. At 
South Plains College, Melody 
was a member of Phi Theta 
Kappa and the Science Club. 
She received the department-
al award for outstanding work 
in biology and was nominated 
for woman of the year in 1972. 
She was chosen to be a state 
summer missionary, repre-
senting the Baptist Student 
Union, in ministry to the Rio 
Grande Valley. 

She graduated from West 
Texas State University in 
1975. There she was elected 
to Alpha Chi and Beta Beta 
Beta honor societies, and was 
a member of the American 
Chemical Society, Baptist 
Student Union, Association of 
Women Students, Baptist 
Young Women, and the 
Castro County Home Demon-
stration Club. 

At TCOM, Dr. Belling- 

Dr. Melody Bellinghausen 

hausen was active in the 
American Osteopathic Asso-
ciation, VVomen Students 
Organization, and Student 
Osteopathic Medical Associa-
tion. 

Dr. Bellinghausen began 
internship at Grand Prairie 
Community Hospital in Grand 
Prairie, Texas on July 1.  
Melody is the daughter-in-law 
of Mr. and Mrs. W.H. 
Bellinghausen of Dimmitt, 
and the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Seth Murphey of 
Levelland. 

County 4-H members 
qualify for state 

Four Castro County 4-H 
Horse Club members quali 

• 

• WRESTLING 
FRIDAY NIGHT 

at the 

County Expo Building 
starting at 8:30 

TAG TEAM MATCH:  
TANK PATTON and ALEX PEREZ 

VS. 

RICKY ROMERO and LARRY LANE 

MAN MOUNTAIN MIKE vs. RICK YOUNGBLOOD 

CAPTAIN'S MATCH:  
TANK PATTON vs. RICKY ROMERO 

Admission Prices: Ringside $4 
General Adm. $3 
12 and Under, $2 

All proceeds will go to help Giristown and for other 
projects 
of the 

Dimmitt United Lions Club. 

fled for the State 4-H Horse 
Show in Fort Worth after 
competing in the District 11 
Horse Show held in Lubbock 
July 1-2. 

Fifteen Castro County 4-H 
Horse Club members partici-
pated in the show, which 
included entrants from 19 
area counties. R. B. Wittie of 
Odessa judged the show. 

Jerri Ka Clark, Norris Cole 
Kelley Hill and John Smith 
qualified for the state show, 
which will be July 22-26. 
Alternates for the state show 
are Jill Brown and Steven 
Bagley. 

At the district show, Kelley 
Hill showed the grand 
champion mare, Impressive 
Reward. Grand champion 
gelding, Last Showdown, was 
shown by John Smith. Sassy 
Doo Bee was the reserve 
champion mare, shown by 
Norris Cole. 

Other winners were: 
Showmanship — Jill 

Brown, 4th; Jerri Ka Clark 
and John Smith. 5th Wel; 
Norris Cole. 7th; Kyle Bag-
welle).  and Connie Dennis, 8th (t  

Registered mares, 5 and 
older — Jerri Ka Clark, 3rd; 
Janet Sammann, 7th. 

Registered mares, under 5 
— Kelley Hill, 1st; Norris 
Cole, 2nd; Kyle Bagwell, 4th. 

Registered geldings, 5 and 
over — Jill Smith, 6th; Jill 
Brown, 7th; Steven Bagley, 
8th. 

Registered geldings, under 
5 — John Smith. 1st; Kennen 
Howell. 2nd: Connie Dennis. 
4th. 

Grade gelding class, all 
ages — Justin Nelson, 1st; 
Joel Nelson, 3rd: Chad Hill, 
9th. 

Western pleasure, all ages 
— John Smith, 6th. 

Western horsemanship, all 
ages — Jerri Ka Clark, 5th, 
Steven Bagley. 7th; Kyle 
Bagwell, 8th. 

VISA' I 
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WAIVER OF FINANCE 
Finance Charges on contracts 

covering New and Used I-H and 

competitive Tractors bought at 

retail thru Oct. 31, 1980 will be 

waived until March 1, 1981. 

HAYS.  

IMPLEMENT 
CO. 

INTERNATIONAL° 
AGRICULTURAL 
EQUIPMENT 

"Items Available In All TG&Y Stores July 10-13 

Today and everyday, TG&Y's prices are better! 
Here are just a few examples of the low prices 
you'll find on your basic needs.„ 

Gale Family Napkins Decorator borders to 
Compliment your patio, picnic or table settings 
Take advantage of this low price. 60 count pkg 
Limit 2 Pkgs. 

Prell• Shampoo Formulated to add fullness 
Scented to add the freshness you like 11 oz 
Price reflects 40C off label Limit 2 

Paper Plates A super buy for your family's next 
outing Don't be caught without 'em! White. 9" 
diameter. 100 count pkg. Limit 2 Pkgs.  

Save 53% on a 
6-pc. screwdriver set 

save a99 1.10 

8-Pc. Screwdriver Sol Quality Screwdriver Set features 
electronically nardened and tempered steel blades 
with comfortable molded handles Includes Midget. 
Stubby, Cabinet. Mechanics. Phillips and Heavy Duty 
Screwdrivers Limit 2 Reg 2 09 

.27 .67 

T G 

Plastic Housewares 
Choice of Dust Pan. Utili-
ty Box. Measuring Cup 
and more,  

Pine Sol* Liquid Tough 
clean-up lobs made 
easier 15 oz Limit 2 

TirTIP.91T-11r1  

1.47 
Pity-Doh' Pelt By 
Kenner' Creative model-
ing compound 4 color 
pack Limit 2 

Flavor-Pop Mold Makes 8 
frozen pops Drip-guard 
sticks included 

etm • rc ..... rim?  

.99 
Lysol* Brand Spray Dis-
infectant Cleans while it 
sanitizes 6 oz aerosol 

.47 
Aloe Vera"' Crum 
Nature's moisture for 
softer skin 6 oz 

.n 

- 
Ma 
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COW POKES By Ace Reid 

"Naw, don't pull any teeth, jist pick the gold fillins' out, 
cause there's old banker Tufernals' collateral!" 

MEMSER OF FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 
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THE trouble with fiction is 
that it makes too much sense, 

;V: whereas reality never makes 
sense. 

Man to speak 
on prisons 

ACCORDING to IRS regula-
tions, ransom paid to a kid-
napper is fully deductable for 
income tax purposes, as long 
as it exceeds $100. 

THE Great Wall of China, 
begun 300 years before the 
birth of Christ, received its 
last constructed addition in 
the sixteenth century. 

Joe R. Garman will speak to 
the First Christian Church of 
Dimmitt on July 15, at 7:30 
p.m. 

Garman is a member of the 
American Correction Chap-
lains' Association, and will 
speak on prison programs 
nationwide. 

There is no admission 
charge and all are invited to 
attend the service, according 
to Roy E. Barringer, minister. 

I DON'T care what is written 
about me so long as it isn't 
true. 

REST TAKE A 
ma BREAK 

For Complete Guaranteed Service on 

ALL TYPES OF ROOFING 
Call 

ROGERS ROOFING COMPANY 
Buck Rogers 

Plainview, Texas 

1400 Thunderbird Drive 
	

806-293-7645 
Texas OH ice of Traffic Safety 

END OF THE LINE—Reeford Burrous, Continental Tele-
phone's customer service supervisor, closes the Dimmitt 
office's doors for the last time Thursday afternoon. The 
Dimmitt and Dumas offices consolidated Monday and service 

ASCS notes 

LILLISTON 

CULTIVATORS 
at 

HAYS 

IMPLEMENT CO. Director advises farmers 
to 'move now' for storage 

requests will now be handled through the Dumas office. 
although local installation and repair personnel will remain in 
Dimmitt. Burrous is now head of dispatching, assigning, 
repairing and testing in the consolidated office. 

Often I am called on to pass 
messages. Some of them, I 
ignore. I simply cannot 
ignore this unusual note to 
Snuffy in South Texas. The 
note is Snuffy still pays his 
car tag fees here in Dimmitt. 
That's a very interesting note 
and I hope Snuffy knows what 
it pertains to. 

By CHARLEY E. HILL 

• Corn on the ground; 
wheat in the street; nobody 
likes it, -  said Stephen 
Pringle, the Texas State ASCS 
Office State Executive 
Director. "But I do remem-
ber some pictures of moun-
tains of grain stacked in the 
open within the past few 
years. 
• "The nation has ample 

storage space for its crops, 
but that storage is not always 
near the places where crops 
get harvested,-  Pringle 
continued. 

Pringle advised elevator 
operators who have Commod-
ity Credit Corporation ICCC) 
owned grain and who will 
need space for 1980 crops to 
request a loading order from 
the Kansas City Commodity 
Office of the Agricultural 
Stabilization and Conservation 
Service (ASCS) right away. 

Railroads have cars avail- 
able now, but after August 1 
the cars will be needed to 
haul 1980 crops. 	Also, 
ASCS's grain inventory man-
agers in Kansas City need 
time to process loading 
orders. 

"Managers must find a 
place to store CCC-owned 
grain before they can process 
an order, and elevators tend 
to offer less space after 
August 1," said Pringle. 

During most of July, the 
managers can process an 
average order in about two 
weeks, but when the August 
rush begins. 

"Move now and avoid the 
rush,-  advised Pringle. 
"CCC forsees that many 
bushels of corn and wheat 
may move from the Corn Belt 
and surrounding states to 
areas where storage is more 
available . . 	mostly in 
Texas.- 

By BRICK AUTRY 
According to a recent story 

in the Amarillo newspaper we 
are all in for a paper shortage. 
What wonderful news! Do 
you remember the Johnny 
Carson joke about the toilet 
paper shortage? The results 
of that were not as funny as 
the joke. It will be a shame if 
the public starts hoarding 
paper. We're so used to just 
tossing. it away. What will 
happen when we start trying 
to collect paper? Where are 
we going to put it all? 

One thing isn't funny. If 
there is a shortage of paper, 
then paper products will go 
up in price. 	The article 
mentioned 	books, 	for 
example. Books which are 
now around ten dollars will 
sell for twenty-five dollars in 
the future, Being a librarian. 
I don't think that's funny at 
all. One small library in 
eastern Texas reports that 
hooks cost so much now that 
once they pay the utilities and 
the salaries they have only 
enough to buy ten new books 
a month. 

This subject is getting to 
me. It is so unpleasant in 
fact, that now I am going to 
turn to other things and intro-
duce the new library aide. 
The new library aide wants to 
remain anonymous. For that 
reason I will introduce him as 
John Doe. 

John Doe plays tennis. He 
is a very good tennis player. 
But he is quite shy Though 
being quite shy and avoiding 
identification in ''View from 
the Library," John Doe is now 
seeking publicity in the tennis 
sports arena. 

Some of the other interests 
John Doe has are tennis 
equipment and tennis clothes. 
He has taken this library aide 
job so that he can explore 
these items more thoroughly. 
(I'm beginning to wonder if 
John Doe has a one track 
mind.) 

As one can see, tennis is 
John Doe's main concern. 
For this reason when you 
come to the library John Doe 
will "serve" you a book 
instead of getting it for you. 
Patrons are advised to look 
sharp for their selections or 
sustain injury. 

CABLE TV 
BETTER PICTURE, 
MORE STATIONS! 

A Cable hook-up 

makes N pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

DIMMITT 

TV CABLE CO. 
NO INSTALLATION 

master changes  
......  — 

CHARGE 

TO41-11 ADVERTISED MERCHANDISE POLICY-TORY • policy Is to shays have 	lased nuirch•ndlse in adequate supply in our stern In 

tee event the unitised merchandise Is not •v•Ilable due to Linter 	 reasons. 'MAY will provide a Rein Check. upon request, in order that the 
merchandise may be purchased at tha ashy price when it become* available, or you may purchase similar quality merchandise at a simiier 
price reduction, • we will be happy to refund your money II you are not satietied with your purchase. it Is the policy& Mir to in that you are 
happy with your starches... • it is !Gilts policy to be priced competitivvily in the market.Repuler Sale Prices may vary market by m•rket, but 

the sale price will &nye be as advertised. 

Phone 647-2364 

wsx  _ 

Your best buy is atitag 

FARMER'S 

SUPPLY CO. 

THE FINEST IN 

Minneapolis-Moline 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO 

REPAIR 

PLAY IT SAFE 

Granting credit is good 
business. but check out 
those requests first with 

your credit bureau. 
That's good business .  

too. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
116 W. Bedford 

Gk 

Uitw from the ibrarg (i. 
;,!•_ 

p. 

Building 

Material for 

Every purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM- 

BARTLETT CO. 

DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

Allis Chalmers 
Farm Equipment 

White Farm Equipment 
Irrigation Engine 
Sales and Service 

Phone 647-2573 
P 0. Box 576 



Phone 647-3123 For All Your Printing Needs 

F
M, 	-••••••" ••••., 

	 ••••=•••• -•••••- "•••I•••".  

DANCE 
To The Music Of 

COUNTRY SOUND 
(Five-piece Band from Dumas) 

DIMMIT1 VFW POST 
Saturday night 

9 p.m. to I a.m. 
$2.50 per person 

OUT OF TOWN 
Mr. and Mrs. Carter Town-

send of Dimmitt are the 
parents of a son, Jared 
Edward, who was born July 3 
in Central Plains General 
Hospital in Plainview. 	He 
weighed 8 pounds, 6 ounces. 
He has a big brother Joel. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Carroll Webb of Dimmitt 
and Mr. and Mrs. Otis Town-
send of Jackson, Miss. WEST TEXAS GAS, INC. 

122 South Broadway 
Dimmitt 

Oil Change - Oil Filter - Lube 

$175°  
PRICE INCLUDES: 

5 OTS TROPARTIC OIL 
PHILLIPS OIL FILTER 
PHILLUBE GREASE 

PLUS! Free 10 Point Service Check 

1 BATTERY WATER LEVEL — TEST! 
2 CHECK COOLING SYSTEM LEVEL 
3 WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID LEVEL 
4 CHECK BELTS AND HOSES 
5 CHECK BRAKE FLUID LEVEL 
6 CHECK TRANSMISSION FLUID LEVEL 
7 CHECK AIR FILTER 
8 CHECK PCV VALVE 
9 CHECK POWER STEERING FLUID LEVEL 
10 CHECK TIRE PRESSURE 

Winter time is gone and vacation time is near- be ready for those 

unexpected or planned trips! 

WE HONOR: 

PHILLIPS TRAVEL CARD 
MASTER CHARGE 

VISA 

This Special Good For Entire Month Of July 

We are pleased to announce that 

Wade Maynard 
has joined our sales staff. 

Wade will be available on Fridays, 
Saturdays and Mondays to consult with 
you on your automotive needs. 

A native of Dimmitt, Wade has had more 
than 25 years' experience in sales. He is 
also a manufacturer's representative for 
Torel Leather Co., and has had the 
five-state distributorship for custom land 
cruisers. 

An antique car buff, Wade owns a 1941 
Ford pickup and a 1940 Ford Deluxe 
2-Door Sedan, which are shown in the 

photo above. 	Both of his antique 
vehicles have been completely restored. 
and have won many awards at antique 
and custom car shows. 

Wade has been active in civic clubs here 
through the years. His wife, Walter, is 
the business manager of South Hills 
Manor. They have a 6-year-old son, 
Wyette. 

We're pleased to have Wade on our 
sales staff, and invite you to come out 
and talk with him, or with any member 
of our sales staff. 

Stan Byrnes Ford, Inc. 
N. Hwy. 385 	 647-2115 

Ford's Factory-Authorized 

REBATES of up to $1,000 

WILL END 

Saturday, July 12! 
11,41,1,11.1.1.  

Kent Birdwell 
116 E. Jones St. 

Dimmitt, Texas 79027 
647-3427 

"See me for car 

home, life, health 

and business 

insurance'  

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there. 

Suit snm ,n1to4Ml COM94.. 

610,1 0',  os Illow.noton ohms 

More about  

Aldermen ... 
[Continued from Page 11 

who felt their privacy was 
being invaded. 

"The census takers did not 
count any permanent resi-
dents in Dimmitt's Labor 
Camp," Edwards said, add-
ing that he assumes "the city 
will work some sort of canvas 
there." 

The only other action the 
city office can make is to 
check the number of water 
meter deposits and connec-
tions, Edwards said. 

He stressed that attempts 
will be made by the district 
office to contact those people 
who did not respond the first 
time around, but those who 
did not respond are encour-
aged to either contact the city 
office or call the Census 
Bureau Office in Amarillo at 
806-335-1656. 

"It's money in their pockets 
if they report, but they're 
losing tax dollars by not 
reporting," Edwards said. 

Before the 10 day period 
allowed ends, a written report 
will be made to officially 
contest the figure made by 
the Census Bureau. 

More about  

Amstar ••• 
(Continued from Page 1], 

capacity is for producing the 
55% sweetener. The ultimate 
cost and output of the project 
will depend on the engineers' 
findings and recommenda-
tions." 

Plant Manager George 
Lamberth, Senior Process 
Consultant Paul Blanchard 
and Research Manager Ed 
Geiger have all been to Japan 
to meet with the Mitsubishi 
engineers and observe that 
company's operating plant 
which is producing 55% 
HFCS, Lapins said. 

First phase of the modifica-
tion project will be demolition 
work—removal of unusable 
equipment,  etc  pouring of new 
floors, 

 

"This will involve about 
half a dozen people, and some 
of our own employees may be 
doing a lot of this work," 
Lapins said. 

He estimated that the con-
struction force will expand to 
30 or so when the major new 
equipment is installed. 

Although Amstar is allott-
ing two years for construction, 
Lapins said he hopes the 
project can be completed in 18 
months. 

Dimmitt Volunteer Firemen 
were called Friday night to a 
grass fire across from the 
airport. 

The fire reportedly started 
from fireworks, but there was 
no damage. 

647.3123 For Printing 

We wish to express our 
sincere thanks to our friends 
and neighbors who harvested 
our wheat for us while Mae 
was in the hospital. 

You're a swell bunch of 
people, and we're grateful to 
you. 

WILLIE AND 
MAE FIAMMONDS 

EI 

BURRITOS 
TACO ROILS 
CORN DOGS 
GERMAN SAUSAGE 
HOT LINKS 
MILD 	. 
BBO CHICKENS 
860 BRICtIT SANOwICk 
BBQ SPARE RIBS . 	 5 .379 
SOUTHERN FRiED PIES 
TACQUITAS . . 
CHILI RElLENOS 
TAMALES 	 . 39 
BEM SANDWIH 	 . S" 25 

LB HOT DOGS 	. 	 5! 19 
ERIEJ CHICK -t, C24..•!ERS 

	
). iY 

	

4 LB. HAM, SA.NDwiCH 
	

SI 4'; 
ROrHITr, 
BEER BA! 	i. ,̀D FISH 
CHILI 	:).N1 	. 
CHiCv.EN 	!i.AK SANDWICH 
STEAK HP:C. 	A'IDWICR! 

WE RESERVE THE VAT TO LIMIT 
PRICES EFFECTIVE JULY 10-12.1900 

SPECIALS GOOD WHILE SUPPLY LASTS - LIMITED SUPPLY 

INFLATION FIGHTING 
SPECIALS FROM... 

Frit, 
Lag:to  

POTATO 7 a C 
_RS 

(al 
F.i 

	CHIPS 	I 

KRAFT 
SPECIALS 

07 129 AMERICAN SLICED 

CHEESE 
12 

 

BORDEN'S 

BUTTER 

MILK 

' GALS 1 
CTN 	

19, 

MIT4FT aRBECIIE C 
SAUCE 	'Bill  

59 

CLOVER CLUB 

I LB 
CAN 

BORDEN'S 

COTTAGE 
CHEESE 

1201. 	C  
CTN. 

BORDEN S 
ICE 

CRENUTTY  

AM SANDWICHES OR 

BUDDIES 

REGULAR ELECTRIC RFRK 

FOLDER'S 
COFFEE 

S  2 9 9  

FOOD 
COOKED 

S MENU 

REFRESHING 

COCA- 
COLA 

6 PACK$ 
CANS 

 

MACARONI AND CHEESE 4 99  
DINNERS 	BORES 

7 f!Z 

; 

MOO,  LUCUPAtIA 	!GUS. 41r 	 C 
OZ 

DRESSING 2 ens 

CARAMELS .. 
1401.5 90 IOW 

FRESH WATERMELONS 	$$49  each 

.... 

r
Oscar 

BOLOGNA 
Mayer or Shurfresh 

140:: 	c 99 each 

Oscar 

CHOPPED 
Mayer 8 oz. 

HAM 
Pkg. 	,.,. 

Tiecach 
Shurfresh 

BACON ' lb. Pkg. 	89c COLBY 
Shurfresh 	10 

CHEESE 
oz. 

99c .  
Shurfresh 

OLEO ' a' Tub 2/1 
00 Roxey 15 

DOG 
oz. Can 

FOOD 4/89` 
PAPER TOWELS 

Hi-Dri Ellis 

69c BEEF 
28 oz. Can 

TAMALES 99c 
CORN 

Shurfresh 

-ON-COB 
8 Mini Ears 79/- %. 

All Flavors 

KOOL-AID 5/$11" 
COOKED FOOD SPECIAL OF THE WEEK 

FISH ON BUN, 	 99C 
TACO ROLLS 	  2/89' 
SMALL PIZZAS 	  59` 
CHILI DOGS 	  69` 

6 CT.  

-- 

LLSUP 
CONVENIENCE STORES 
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Chicken fry 
set at Bethel 

13-year-olds 	Missionary win 

play tonight 	present program 

at Bible Baptist Dimmitt's 13-year-old base-
ball all-stars will play tonight 
IThursdayl for the District 
championship in Olton. The 
team defeated Muleshoe 
Monday night and Plainview 
Wednesday and will play the 
winner of the Plainview-Mule-
shoe game. 

In other all-star action, the 
Sr. Babe Ruth team was 
narrowly defeated Thursday 
by Muleshoe in the eighth 
inning. The final score was 
11-10. Morton defeated 
Dimmitt Saturday 13-11 in the 
ninth inning. 

Dimmitt will host the West 
Texas State Babe Ruth Tour-
nament July 21-26 with teams 
from across the state compet-
ing. Dimmitt's 14-15 year old 
all-stars drew a bye as the 
host team and will not play 
until the state tournament, to 
be held at the Babe Ruth 
Park. 

The annual Bethel Chicken 
Fry is scheduled for Friday at 
8 p.m. at the Bethel Commun-
ity Building. 

All families in the commun-
ity are invited and they should 
bring their chicken to the 
community building by 6 p.m. 

Rev. and Mrs. Ben Mock, 
Missionaries to Equador, will 
be in services at the Bible 
Baptist Church, 501 SE 3rd 
Street in Dimmitt for the 
Sunday morning worship 
services commencing at 10 
a.m. Rev. Mock will be 
showing slides of the 
Equadorian mission field and 
will also be preaching in the 
morning worship services 
commencing at 10:30. 
The general public is invited 
to see this slide presentation 
and to hear a message from 
this missionary to Equador. 



BARGAIN 
OF THE 
MONTH 

Just press the top for a steady stream of your favorite bev-

erage. This vacuum insulated dispenser keeps liquids hot 

or cold for hours. Compact and lightweight, with a carrying 

handle. Take it along on trips and picnics for no-spill dis-

pensing. And it's attractively designed for buffet 
serving. 	 P150A 

KILLINGSWORTH 
TRUE VALUE HARDWARE 

QUART 
now THERMOS 

99 
While 

Supplies 
Last 

super 
convenient 
built-in-drink 
dispenser 

V3 OFF! 

OPEN STOCK SALE THRU JULY 19 

Oneida's Finest Silverplate, 

Gold Electroplate and Stainless 

Pante 1Rexatt Thug 

    

FORD1  
Call  auIr 

Service Department at 

    

  

C4> 

 

    

    

647-2115 

Stan Byrnes Ford, Inc. 

Haue A Happg 'Dag 
willt 

*Doktuto 
	 *Legg gokuo 

*-Twioto 
	

*Ciuttaattut Redo 

*Rote Riffeto 
	

*Cake Douglututo 

*Ceize 
	 *ton. Peppot 

* N1iQk 	*Ottiutge attire 
Eat 'aft Wide Wilk co6bec oast Ail*, stint on now Oct 

nn pick 'aft up at nun mauled. Awe-up wigdout. 

103 14W 414 
Tke Swat 

Plow 647-4253 

Guide to Good Dining 

illodian.3outL BUFFET 
Every 

FRIDAY EVENING 
all you can eat for only 

$3.50 
this Is your opportunity to get a taste of Old Mexico 

through the medium of the finest Mexican Foods 

For your noontime eating pleasure 

TRY OUR FISH BUFFET 
every Friday 

only $3.50 
We prepare a complete Buffet line of fine foods every day, 

or you can order from our menu to be prepared to your tcste. 

Ann's Steak House Cafe 
113512nd 	 647-5334 

....HERE'S JUST A FEW! 

PERSONALIZED 
STATIONERY 

REGISTE 
sr.'''.  • FORMS 

MULTI-PART 
SETS 	 SALES 

BOOKS 
CARBON INTERLEAVED AND CARBONLES 

WIRE-0 BOUN 
BOOKS 

PADDED FORMS 

BIG 

When you need: 
Tires Installed 
Tires Repaired 
Brakes Adjusted 
Brake Shoes Replaced 

Wheels Balanced 
Front End Aligned 
Battery Replaced 

Oil Changed 

Tank Filled 
Filters Replaced 

. we're ready! 

Hi-Plains Oil Co., Inc. 

Safety Lane Tire Service 

Brake Work - Wheel Alignment - Farm Service 
MICHELIN 	 SUMMITT 	MONARCH 

CHAMPLIN OIL, GAS, DIESEL 
Days: 647-4549 	 Nights: 647-4633 

DO YOU KNOW that the average pump 
efficiency on the Texas High Plains is 
about 52''',? That's well below the 75% 
that it is practical to achieve. 

BIG T PUMP CO. has the machine that 
will help you lower your pump's fuel 
consumption and increase your pump's 
efficiency. 
Whenever your water needs a lift, 
contact us. 

George Hudson, Mgr. 
647-4171 

PIMP CO. 
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Dimmitt Business and Industrial Review 
SPECIAL of the week! 

e BLACK-&-WHITE 

711//m  PORTABLE TV 

The GALESBURG • L120C - 12 diagonal personal 
size black-and-white portable finished in handsome 

Charcoal Brown. Features 100% solid-state chassis 
for outstanding performance. Quick-on Sunshine 

picture tube provides sharp picture detail. Precision 
Video Range solid-slate tuning with Perma-Set VHF 
fine-tuning and 70-position UHF channel selector. 

Compact size. compact price. 

The quality goes in before the name goes onl 

Kittrell Electronics 

204 W. Bedford 	 647-2197 

Witit today's 

gas prices, a 

summer tune-up 
will save you money on your 

(motion and summer driving! A III 	III 	III 
Most-wanted Open Stock and Serving Pieces 

under. (-30°0 cotton underwear 

that is soft & durable. Re-

inforced of stress points. 

Sizes 28-44 Brief. S-M-L- Visa 
"l. T-shirt. White only.  

& Master Charge 
It 

FRESH DAILY 
* Doughnuts 

* Apple Fritters 

* Long Johns 

* Twists 

* Cinnamon Rolls 

* Cake Doughnuts 

Eat 'em inside with coffee, soft drink or 

milk or pick 'em up at our convenient 

drive-up window. 

Phone ahead for Special Orders 
and Party Arrangements 

the Sweet Slop 
103 NW Fourth 	 647-4253 

(Behind Somethin' Special) 

Exclusive Dealer 

For Ennis Business Forms 

Castro County News 
108 W. Bedford 	 647-3123 

A financial program tail-
ored to your individual 
situation will help you get 
the special things you 
save for. Let our counsel-
ors explain the advantages 
of savings certificates and 
passbook savings ac-
counts Select the plan 
that will best help you 
reach your financial goals. 

First State Bank 
of Dimmitt 

Member F.D.I.C. 

WE 

CAN FILL 

YOUR NEEDS 

gi 

11 	t 4.  We have large 

`1 It 	Stocks of Materials 

NJ, 13- 	for Home Building 

\ 	and Repairs 

See us for your building hardware 

and tools 

Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 

T -HEREFORD- FRIONA 
DALHART 

Hanes'Men's 

BRIEFS & 

T-SHIRTS 

BRIEFS 

3 for $599 

T-SHIRTS 

3 for $6"  
Hanes mokes you feel 

dhe:~1 
C A ANTHONY CO   

Otegrituj Hutougk Sato*, 6 to 6 De* 

Saving for 
something 

special 



Only '1272  

ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

BUILDING 
MATERIALS 

DEPENDABLE 
SERVICE 

Phone 938-2183 
Hart and Tulia 

DON'T LET THE 
SOUTHWESTERN 

CORN BORER AND 
SORGHUM INSECTS 

ROB YOU OF PROFITS 
Don't let your corn be a pushover for southwestern corn borer. Get 

effective control with liquid SEVIMOL 4 carbaryl insecticide. 

SEVIMOL 4 is your economical answer to southwestern corn borer 

and other corn and sorghum pests. It's the liquid formulation of 

SEVIN ... the insecticide that's been working hard for farm profits 

for 20 years. See us for more information. 

STOP! ALL PESTICIDES CAN BE HARMFUL TO HEALTH AND THE 

ENVIRONMENT IF MISUSED. READ THE LABEL CAREFULLY AND  

USE ONLY AS DIRECTED.  

SEVIMOL' 
RIVERSIDE CHEMICAL CO. 

Highway 385 North 
Dimmitt, Texas 79027 

806-647-4125 

Your Headquarters For 

SWEEPS 
is 

Hays Implement Co. 

• Large Stock 

• Factory Hard-Surfaced 

• Plain 

wvvvvvvvvvvvvv 

1 c SALE 	I  4 

4 

Over 7,000 Pairs Of Shoes 
Women's — Men's — Children's 

ALL FAMOUS BRANDS 
SALE STARTS 

THURSDAY, JULY 10 

BATES 
ao<n 
	piTORE 

Tulia, Texas 
	 4 

• •• • •• • • • 

4 

4 

4 

4 

4 

4 

I. 

CAN YOU RESIST THIS FACE? The dog's, that is. This cute 
female puppy was picked up Thursday and is gray and white 
streaked. Unless she is given a home by July 14, the puppy 
will be 'put to sleep' according to Animal Warden Charles 
Whitman. She can be yours for a fee of $7 for rabies shot, 
$7.50 pick-up fee and SI per day room and board, but Whitman 
says he is "willing to negotiate the price if necessary." To 
purchase this puppy, phone Whitman at 647-4545. 

Roping buckle to be awarded 

603 S.E. 3rd (S. Hwy. 385) 	Dimmitt Phone 647-4121 

XAWW XM+SWW XWW 

COMPARE QUALITY. 
COMPARE PRICE. 
AND YOU'LL GO 41, 
MICHELIN! 

SIN 

225x15 
XM + SWW 

92.95 FET 
3.40 

225x15 XWW 

90.25 
FET 3.34 

205x15 XWW 

82.50 
FET 2.72 

We are equipped to render a complete tire service 	 

Wheel Balancing Brake Repair 	Alignment 

Orahe•Farm Tire Service 

PAXTON TIRE &SERVICE 

master charge 
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weekend guests of Myrtle 
Behrends. also here for both 
receptions. and Shannon 
Truelock of Seguin here to 
visit grandmother Myrtle 
Behrends. 

Jo Gregory and son Don 
and Ellen and their children 
Becky and Keith Gregory and 
cousin Brian all went to La 
Mesa for the holiday visit with 
Jo's sister-in-law Arnie' 
Wright. 

Woodrow and Alyce 
Killingsworth went to Tulsa 
for a short visit with daughter 
Kay. Troy and children. 
Their son Jim and son Chad 
went to Angel Fire for 
business and a change of 
weather up there. 

Bill and Katy Graham and 
family and Ted and Dorothy 
Sheffy went to Andrews for 
the funeral service of Katy's 
dad, Mr. Leroy Davis. He has 
been ill for awhile. 	The 
Graham's daughter Mary and 
husband Kent Gabel and 
children have moved from 
here to Canyon. 	He is 
farming some Arney land 
north of Nazareth. 

Pat and A. P. or Slick Fligh 
of Monahans spent the week 
with her parents Mayor Elmer 
and Mauzee Youts. 	Also 
visited sister Phylis and Bob  

Mooney and their other 
guests were Bob's brother 
Jack and Shirley Mooney from 
Denver and their daughter 
Janet and Max Wohlgemuth. 
They visited his parents too, 
who are Dr. James and 
Charley Wohlgemuth. Their 
son Michael and Arlene and 
baby were here from Burleson 
and they and Dr. and Charley 
went to Santa Fe to see 
everything and out to the 
horse races. They had a good 
time shopping and looking. 
Baby Christen stayed for a 
visit. 

It's a boy for Brock and 
Susan Merritt. His name is 
Dereck Lee. Grandparents 
are Glenn and Mona Merritt 
and Gerald and Jean Sitterley 
of Houston. Greats and Earl 
and Mabel Brock. The big 
brother is Brian. 

43 members of the Claude 
Johnson family spent the 4th 
and 5th of July at Jim and 
Myrtle Johnson's cabin at 
White River Lake. 

Those attending were nine 
of the Thacker family from 
Lawton, Okla., four of the 
Moffett Smith family from 
Springfield, Va., seven of the 
McKinney family from Bridge 
City and Houston, four of the 
Carol Dennis family from 
Garden City, Kansas and 
Keith Chrene and Keldon 
Johnson from Plainview. 

Also attending were 
Kowean Crader from Duran-
go, Colo., five of the Carl 
Russell family from Lubbock, 
Debbie Smith and friends 
Mario Rivas and Dr. Debbi 
Hegi from Lubbock, C. J., 
Omega and Dora Johnson 
from Dimmitt and the host 
and hostess, Jimmie, Myrle, 
Steven and Becky Johnson 
from Lubbock. 

All enjoyed the bountiful 
spread at every meal, with 
four freezers of ice cream, 
watermelon and iced drinks 
thrown in. 	Boating, skiing, 
fishing, games of bridge, and 
Skip-Bo, fireworks and family 
singing at night were also 
enjoyed. 

IN 1975 a young woman 
won a contest held in Dallas, 
Texas — she was able to hold 
248 pennies in her mouth all 
at once. 

JETLINERS fly at high 
altitudes because the thinner 
atmosphere offers less 
resistance, hence using less 
fuel. 

The last organizational 
meeting for the Dimmitt Soft-
ball League will be held Mon-
day night at 7:30 in the 
courthouse community room. 

This meeting will be the 
deadline for interested teams 
to enter the league. Teams 
wanting to play in the league 
should bring a complete 
roster of players and $100 for 
the team fee, according to 
league chairman Jackie 
Gunnels. Schedules will be 
drawn up at this meeting also. 

Umpires are needed for the 
league games, and interested 
men should call Gunnels at 
647-3285. They will be paid 
$7 per game. 

FFA members 
to be honored 

Morris Cole and Greg 
Odom will be honored during 
the State FFA Convention in 
Houston July 9-11. 

Cole, chapter president, 
will receive an award for 
being selected as Star Lone 
Star farmer for Area I, and 
Odom will get an award for 
being chosen as Star Green-
hand of Area I. 

Also attending the conven-
tion are Lee Schilling and 
chapter advisor Ed Standlee. 

The convention is being 
held at the Astroarena, with 
former Texas Governor John 
Connally being the keynote 
speaker. The new State FFA 
President will be elected and 
scholarships are to be 
awarded. 

Miss Crozier 
on dean's list 

Leanne Crozier, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Crozier 
of Dimmitt, was among the 
144 students making the 
Spring 1980 Dean's List at 
Lubbock Christian College. 

Miss Crozier compiled a 
3.76 grade point average and 
is majoring in Home 
Economics. 

HOSPITAL NEWS 
PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL: 
Henry Behrends 
Melissa Brockman 
Norma Carrasco 
Mary Dixon 
Elmer Dixon 
Clara Fuller 
Jenifer Hanners 
Estella Leyva 
Connie Martinez 
Ruby Maples 
Helen McLean 
Connie Perez 
Tomas Rodriquez 
Florence Spencer 
Albino Trevino 
Donna Bull 
PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
C. F. McCormick 
Reyes Sanchez 
Debbie Puente 
Louie Schacher 
Irene Granado 
Choc Lay 

BEES use less than two 
ounces of wax in building a 
honeycomb that will hold 
more than four pounds of 
honey. 

THERE is a law in the U.S. 
which makes it illegal to cover 
a ceiling with an American 
flag. 

The Dimmitt Rodeo Assoc-
iation will award its jackpot 
roping buckle July 26 instead 
of July 19 as originally 
planned because the sched-
uled date is in conflict with 
the Earth rodeo. 

Roping is held each Satur-
day at 8 p.m. with books 
opening at 7 at the Dimmitt 
Rodeo Arena. Cost is five 
heads for. $20, progressive 
after one. 

To be eligible for the 
buckle. teams must be 
present at three ropings. The  

team with the top average on 
the final night will be 
awarded the buckle. 

Jackpot roping is open to all 
interested persons. 

Your chances 
of dying 
from a heart attack 
or stroke are 50-50. 

American Heart Association 

More about 

 

Final meeting r__pet pared 
set for local 
softball teams 



Mrs. Gary Norman 

13itithi Shown 
kw* 

Sue Rita King 
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10:00 9.itt to 12:00 
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Couple recently married 
in afternoon ceremony 

Lyle Shive, Diana Dycus 
married June 28 in Canyon Socially 

Yours 
June Norris and Gary 

Norman were married in an 
afternoon ceremony June 14 
at the First Baptist Church in 
Dimmitt. Ronnie Parker 
officiated the formal, double 
ring ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Clarence and Lee Norris, and 
the groom is the son of Mrs. 
Claudell 	Norman 	of 
Plainview. 

The ceremony was per-
formed under a greenery 
covered arch. Two seven 
branched candelabras decor-
ated the altar along with a 
large basket of yellow gladio-
las and carnations. Yellow 
and white bows marked the 
ends of each pew. 

Janet Mays, sister of the 
bride, was matron of honor. 
Shirley Norris, sister of the 
bride, was the bridesmaid. 

Andy Mays served as the 
best man and Kelly Hinds 
was the groomsman. 

Candles were lit by Raynel 
Johnson. Eric Mays, the 
bride's nephew, was the ring 
bearer. Jamie Stidham, 
cousin of the bride, and 
Jessica Norman. niece of the 
groom. carried baskets of 
daisies and greenery. 

Guests were seated by 
Roger Jones of Plainview and 
Paul Parsons of Dimmitt. 
Guests were registered by 
Candace Stewart. 

Organ music was provided 
by Shirley Peggram and vocal 
selections were sung by Janet 
Wohlgemuth of Canyon. 

Escorted to the altar by her 
father and her nephew, Eric 
Mays, the bride wore a 
candlelight gown of satin and 
English net with Alencon 
lace. 	The gown.  had a 
wedding ring neckline with 
sheer yokes. long tapered 
sleeves and an empire waist. 
The yokes, bodices, neckline 
and sleeves were accented 
with Alencon and bristol lace. 
The bias cut satin skirt softly 
gathered at the back waist-
line. The front panel was 
enhanced with rows of bristol 
lace and the hemline was 
edged with the same lace. 
The gown featured a chapel 
length train and a veil of 
cathedral length ivory net. 
The bride carried a bouquet of 
roses, daisies and baby's 
breath. She carried a Bible 
given to her by her grand-
mother for something new. 
She had an English sixpence 
in her shoe for something old. 
For something blue, she wore 
a blue garter. She also wore 
her grandmother's engage-
ment ring. 

The bride's attendants' 
dresses were of yellow eyelet 
lace with a natural waistline 
and were worn off the 
shoulder. 

Following the ceremony, 
the reception was held in the 
fellowship hall. Angie Silva, 
Candace Stewart and Teresa 
Parsons served cake and 
punch. 

For the wedding trip, the 
bride wore a multi-color sun 
dress with a white blazer. 
The trip was to Phoenix, 
Ariz., Las Vegas, Nev., and 
Los Angeles. Calif. 

The bride is a 1980 grad-
uate of Dimmitt High School 
and plans to attend Metro 
Barber College in Amarillo. 
The groom is a 1973 graduate 
of Plainview High School and 
attended Wayland College. 
He is employed by Amstar. 

LAND-SALE frauds are 
back. Interested buyers 
should see property firsthand, 
read the property report and 
sign nothing until fully 
informed. 

TO RENEW VOWS-Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Davis of Hart will 
renew their marriage vows Sunday at 3 p.m. in the First 
Baptist Church in Hart in celebration of their 25th wedding 
anniversary. Their children will host a reception immediately 
following in the fellowship hall of the church. Mr. and Mrs. 
Davis were married July 10, 1955 in Hart. Friends of the 
couple are invited to attend the ceremony and reception. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Jay 
Shive are at home in Amarillo 
following their June 28 
wedding in the Joseph Hill 
Memorial Chapel on the West 
Texas State University 
campus in Canyon. 

The bride is the former 
Diana Kathryn Dycus of 
Canyon. She is the daughter 
of Charles and Janis Padgett 
of Duncanville. Shive is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Noah 
Spencer of Dimmitt and Mr. 
and Mrs. Eldon Shive of 
Amarillo. 

Rev. Jim Hancock, pastor 
of the First Baptist Church in 
Canyon officiated the formal, 
double ring ceremony held at 
11 a.m. 

Dana Dycus, the bride's 
sister-in-law of Duncanville, 
was matron of honor. Best 
man was Kenneth Irlbeck of 
Dimmitt. The bride's 
brother, Donnie Dycus, 
ushered guests to their seats. 

Palms, ferns and other 
greenery gave a garden effect 
to the chapel. Two three-
branched candelabras and a 
unity candle completed the 
altar decorations. 

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a 
formal length wedding gown 
of nylon organza and 
reembroidered Alencon lace 
over bridal taffeta. The gown 
featured a high rounded neck-
line, semi-Empire waist, long 
bishop sleeves and a full skirt. 
Inserts of lace complimented 
the neckline, bodice, sleeves 
and skirt. 

The hemline was enhanced 
with a border of matching lace 
and the full back of the gown 
ended in a sweeping chapel 
length train. The bride's veil 
of imported illusion and a 
border of matching lace fell 
from a pearled coif. 

She carried a bouquet of 
white rosebuds and lily of the 
valley. 

The matron of honor wore a 
formal-length gown of light 
blue chiffon featuring an 
empire waist and full skirt. 

She carried a bouquet of 
light blue zinnias, morning 

riki I, "I 	.. 	.1-  I r 
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Mrs. Lyle Jay Shive 

glory. sweet pea and white 
daisies. Both the bride's 
bouquet and matron of 
honor's bouquet were of silk 
and were designed and 
constructed by the bride. 

Mrs. Jan Word of Canyon 
sang "The Wedding Song" 
during the lighting of the 
unity candle. 

An outdoor reception was 
held immediately following 
the ceremony. • A three-tiered 
cake decorated in silk flowers 
and cherubs was featured at 
the bride's table. Punch, nuts 
and mints were also served by 
Mrs. Marta • klbetk of 
Dimmitt and Mrs. Pam White 
of Muleshoe. 

The couple chose Colorado 

Springs, Colo. and Raton, 
N.M. for their honeymoon 
trip. 

Mrs. Shive is a 1976 
graduate of Duncanville High 
School and a 1980 graduate of 
West Texas State University. 
She will attend Medical Tech-
nology School at Northwest 
Texas Hospital this fall. 

The groom is a 1976 
Dimmitt High School grad-
uate and _ attends Amarillo 
College. He is employed by 
Micro Chemical in Amarillo. 

The couple was honored 
June 15 with a wedding 
shower in Duncanville. Host-
esses included Mrs. Mary 
Ebert, Kim Ebert and Pam 
Batley, all of Duncanville. 

•
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THE only words in the 
English language that contain 
the vowels a, e, i, o, u in 
order are abstemious and 
facetious. 

Happy 

anniversary! 
BILLIONAIRE H.L. Hunt 

always brought his lunch to 
work every day in a brown 
paper bag that was specially 
designed by his grand-
children. 

Photography by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

VJEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS. TEXAS 

Box 484 
	

Phone 684-2535 

INSTALLMENT credit hit a 
record-high $300 billion at the 
first of the year - excluding,  
mortgages and loans by' 
parents to make down 
payments. 

Ofwmaar-st ran-4.-r at cr_nriiiii 
[Compiled from the Commun• 
ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth 
American Legion Auxiliary.] 

JULY 10 - Carroll end 
Eileen Burnam. Glenn and 
Jan Ramaekers, James and 
Pearl Acker. 

JULY 12 - Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Birkenfeld, Rocky 
and Sherry Kay. 

JULY 14 - Noel and Oleta 
Gollehon, James and Reta 
Welch, Danny and Donna 
Newton, Jack and Susie Brad-
ford, George and Carolyn 
Sides, Gene and Michele 
Schmucker. 

JULY 15 - Dan and Jean 
Petty, Truman and Betty 
Touchstone, J.C. and Rhoda 
Mays, Kyle and Kippy 
Broderson, Stephen and 
Amparo Villanueva, Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Kiernan, Joe Lynn 
and Mary Lou Birkenfeld, 
Gregg and Mary Lou 
Venhaus. 

JULY 16 - Billy Jack and 
Jeton Gregory. 

PUBLISHER'S-  COPY 
of civilian-
the U.S. is 

arm every male 
in the country 
ages of 18 and 

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION 
(Including Domestic Subsidiaries). 

THE amount 
owned guns in 
sufficient to 
and female 
between the 
64. 

LEGAL TITLE OF BANK 

The First State Bank of Dimmitt, Dimmitt, Texas 

CITY 

D irran i t t 

STATE BANK NO 

ZIP CODE 

79027 

COUNTY 

Castro 

FEDERAL RESERVE DIST. NO. 

STATE 

Texas 

CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE 

11 	 1  trIfi  31._1980 1  
ASSETS 
1. Cash and due from banks 	  
2. Due from other depositories and all cash items in the process of collection 	  
3. U.S. Treasury securities 	  
4. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	  
5. Obligations of States and political subdivisions in the United States 	  
6. All other securities 	  
7. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell 	  
8. Total loans (including overdrafts totaling $  5.820 19 )(From Schedule A, Item 8) 	  
9. Lease financing receivables 	  

10. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 	  
11. Real estate owned other than bank premises .. . 
12. Letters of credit and customers' liability on acceptances outstanding 	  
13. All other assets 	  
14. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 131 	  

1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 
9 

10 
11 
12 
13 
14 Libby Crooks 

is hostess 

Texas 

Seterlitue of Tke Waage Skep ' 

Cobbs cud ?mem 
C--171442 	 
t721Laed__ 

LIABILITIES 

15. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations . 
16. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 
17. Deposits of United States Government 
18 Deposits of States and political subdivisions in the United States . 
19 Due to banks 	  
20 All other deposits 	  
21. Certified and officers' checks . 
22. Total Deposits (sum of items 15 thru 21) 

a Total demand deposits ........... 
b. Total time and savings deposits 	 

23. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 
24. Interest-bearing demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury and 

	

other liabilities for borrowed money 	  
25. Mortgage indebtedress for which the bank is directly liable 
26. Unearned discount on loans 
27. Letters of credit and acceptances outstanding 	. 
28. All other liabilities 	.......................... 	- 

15 
16 
17 
18 
19 
20 
21 
22 
22a 
22b 
23 

Libby Crooks of Childress, 
daughter of former Dimmitt 
residents Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Crooks, is a member 
of the hospitality crew of the 
musical drama "Texas." 

Held at the Palo Duro 
Canyon amphitheater, 
"Texas" has added two new 
numbers this year. The show 
is in its 15th season and 
people are again coming from 
over 500 miles and out of 
state to view the drama. 

Miss Crooks is the niece of 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Smith of 
Dimmitt. 

IT is better to remain silent 
and be thought a fool, than to 
open your mouth and remove 
all doubt. 

24 
25 
26 
27 
28 
29 
30 
31 

32 
33 
34 
35 
36 
37 

35. Uncertified surplus, reserve for contingencies, and other capital reserves 	  
36. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 35) 	  
37. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND  EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 29, 30, 31 and 36) 

NOTE This report must be signed by an authorized officer and attested by not lees than three directors other than the officer signing the report 

13,11:42 %owe 
luutolia9 

Catitti Dget  
hide-pied 

Befit fie End 
Tkutsclay. 9uhi 24, 1980 

10:00 to 0:30 a.m. 

IN titk keste 

29. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) ;sum of items 22 thru 28) 
30 Subordinated notes and debentures 
31, Allowance for possible loan and investment losses 

EQUITY CAPITAL 

32 Common stock (No. of shares outstanding 1.49_,_Z50  
33. Certified surplus 	  
34 Undivided profits 	  

/ 	i (806) 647-4151 	1  July 7, 1980 

RIZED TO SIGN PEPOPT 	. We the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of Con 
! dition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that it has been ex  

amined by us and to the best of our knowledge and belief has been pre 
eared in conformance with the instructions and Is true and correct 

erl  ' • 

NAM 	till TITLE OF 0
t 

Fl ER NUT 

James R. Horton, Exec. Vice Pres. 

SIGNATU• 0 IR CTOFI 	 SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR 

ON. huh Wioe 

head Stud - 

64E44 raja seudt 4 Piste Sheet. 

Dimwit Texco 7)r)/trairr_f_l_r_r) 1(  • 
k 

(MAKE MARK FOR 
NOTARY'S SEAL) 

Caqtro 	 
.Tiqy 	19 B 

Notary Public 

. County 
7_th 	day 

. 19 
SrateSowforn to an-ris 	be 	me this subscribed 
My commission expires /' 	_ 



Our 

July 

Clearance 

Sale 
will begin at 9 a.m. Tuesday, 

with savings up to 50% 

throughout our store 

We will be closed Monday 

to mark down prices. 

The Place To Go! 

You could save 35% 
on Homeowners 
Dwelling rates. 

Here in Castro 
County, Allstate 
now allows a 35% 
saving on Home-
owners Dwelling in-
surance rates for 
homes that qualify. 

We'd like to tell you about this rate 
deviation. Just call, or drop in, and 
compare. Bring your present Home-
owners policy if you like. 

Jones-Rawlings Agency 
121 E. Bedford 	 647-5244 
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Sunnyside Mr. and Mrs. Anderson 

at home after wedding 
Community enjoys holiday Creative Weddings 

We do the complete reception for 

weddings and anniversaries. 

• Cakes with Hand Molded Flowers fl 
By TEENY BOWDEN 

The July 4th activities at 
the community building spon-
sored by the Lions Club was 
well attended. Games includ-
ed pitching horseshoes, 
volleyball, cake walks, and a 
stick horse rodeo. There was 
a dunking board, a picnic 
supper with homemade ice 
cream, visiting, and fireworks 
after dark. 

S 

• Brass and Silver Appointments 

The party will be Thursday 
morning July 31 from 10:00 
until 11:00 at the church. All 
children who read one or 
more books are invited. Two 
girls reached the moon this 
week by reading 25 books so 
far. Gwendolyn and Melinda 
Wilson were presented 
"moon rocks" and a minia-
ture robot in the Sunday 
morning services. It takes 10 
books to reach Mars and ten 
more to reach Saturn. The 
reading program ends July 
27. 

Mrs. David Sadler, Melody 
and Karla were in Hereford 
Tuesday to attend the pro-
gram for the American Legion 
led by the junior members. 
Melody played the trumpet, 
Karla led the pledge of 
allegiance. The girls stayed 
until Thursday with their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jacob King. 

Baptist women met Tues-
day morning for their general 
program. and BYW and 
Mission Friends met Tuesday 
afternoon. 

• Assortment of Cloths, Draped and Tailored 

spent the day Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Tex Conard and 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Warren Gerhing of Indiana. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jacob King. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ezell Sadler 
and Cheryl Powell, and Mr. 
and Mrs. David Sadler had 
supper with them after church 
Sunday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Powell 
of Canadian arrived Sunday 
night to visit through Tuesday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Ezell 
Sadler and the Larry and 
David Sadlers. 

• Also specializing in Birthday Cakes and 
Supplies 

Owners; Johnnie Battey and Martha Lytal 

426 Western, Hereford, Texas 364-6711 fl 
ur71,66"hire-ae-rsan-Ti-erm-19"--Cro0.-C"-Ori,-.9"-41",-49"̂ -0"-OnsCr".04-0  

Mrs. David Anderson 
. . the former LeAnna Newman 

Mr. and Mrs. David Ander-
son are at home in Dimmitt 
after their recent wedding. 

LeAnna Newman and 
t Anderson exchanged wedding 
vows in the late afternoon 

:ceremony Saturday. June 14, 
at the Assembly of God 
Church in Dimmitt. 

• Monte Wike. pastor, offic-
iated the ceremony at an altar 
decorated with an arch of tiny 

:white flowers and greenery. 
The aisle of the church was 

' decorated with bows of blue 
and white. 

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a 
formal length gown of white 
satin accented with lace. Her 
floor length veil fell from a 
caplet of white lace accented 
with tiny seed pearls. The 
dress was made by the grand-
mother of the bride, Lorene 
Newman. She carried a 
bouquet of blue and white 
carnations. 

Mammie Johnson, matron 
of honor, wore a floor length 
gown of soft blue. 	She 

:carried a bouquet of blue and 
white carnations. 

Danny Anderson, brother of 
the groom, acted as best man. 

Barry Oldfield and Stever 
Anderson served as ushers. 

Mark Broadstreet, organist, 
played both the processional 
and recessional. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Alan Newman 
of Dimmitt and Sherry Ratliff 
of Amarillo. The groom is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Anderson of Dimmitt. 

A reception followed the 
ceremony at the home of the 
bride's father. Crystal 
appointments adorned the 
table which was covered in a 
white lace table cloth over 
blue. The bride's cake was 
topped with the traditional 
bride and groom. 

Only store 
clean clothes 

The groom's table, also 
covered with a lace table cloth 
over blue, featured a basket 
of blue flowers. His cake was 
decorated with brown and 
white. 

The bride's traveling attire 
was a soft blue dress. The 
couple spent their honeymoon 
in Lubbock. 

The bride is a graduate of 
Canyon High School. 	The 
groom is a 1978 graduate of 
Dimmitt High School. 

Cheryl Powell of Canadian 
arrived Tuesday to spend the 
rest of the summer with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ezell Sadler, and the Larry 
Sadler family. 

David Sadler was honored 
with a birthday supper in the 
home of his parents Thursday 
night, Mr. and Mrs. Ezell 
Sadler. Those present were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jacob King of 
Hereford, Mrs. Tex Conard of 
Dimmitt, Cheryl Powell of 
Canadian. Randy Powell of 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Sadler, Carrie, Stacy, and 
Laura, and Mr. and Mrs. 
David Sadler, Melody and 
Karla. Mr. and Mrs. King 
spent Thursday night with the 
Ezell Sadlers. 

Holly and Gay Waggoner 
left Sunday with a church 
group for a weeks camp at 
Camp Blue Haven near Las 
Vegas. N.M. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Brown 
and Lynn Brown spent Satur-
day in Lubbock with the 
Brown family. 	Jason and 
Jared stayed with Mr. and 
Mrs. A. J. Jones. Rev. and 
Mrs. Raymond Jones and Mr. 
and Mrs. Milburn Haydon 
visited with the Brown family 
in Lubbock Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jacob King, 
and Mr. and Mrs. David 
Sadler and girls had dinner 
Friday July 4th with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ezell Sadler. Mr. and 
Mrs. Tim Dawson of Hereford 
and the Larry Sadlers visited 
with them in the afternoon 
and had supper with them. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Sadler, 
Carrie, Stacy, and Laura 

Always store clothing clean 
when making seasonal 
switches, advises Nancy 
Brown, a clothing specialist. 

Soil will weaken fibers over 
a period of time and will tend 
to attract insects, she 
explains. 

Miss Brown is with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. 

Launder washables and 
have non-washables dry 
cleaned, she continues. 

Place hanging garments in 
garment or plastic bags. 

Fold items to be boxed and 
pack with tissue in between to 
reduce wrinkles. 

As a precaution. sprinkle 
moth crystals or use moth 
halls when storing woolens. 

Label all boxes for easy 
access, the specialist advises. 

Keep sweaters and jackets 
handy for the first cool 
weather of fall. 

Wash all accessories made 
of man-made materials such 
as shoes and handbags with 
sudsy sponge. Rinse and dry 
well. 

Stuff boots, shoes and bags 
with paper to retain their 
shape. 

Store these in boxes. Use 
old socks as protective shoe-
bags, Miss Brown adds. 

Let The Rapid Roof System 

Your Roofing Dollars 
Thar 

IN DUMAS 
WE'LL BE DOING OUR BEST 

TO DO MORE FOR YOU. 

Reck )1 LI Jilin Ron Killion Carolyn Hagler 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Brown 
were called to Lubbock Friday 
night when his father, E. R. 
Brown of Lubbock, suffered a 
heart attack. He passed away 
Sunday morning in Methodist 
Hospital. He was 87, and had 
been in the hospital all week 
for tests, but was not very 
sick when he had the unex- 
pected heart attack. 	Cliff 
spent the weekend in 
Lubbock. 

Rain amounts varied over 
the community Thursday 
afternoon from a trace to an 
inch or more. .70 inch was 
recorded. 

Mrs. J. C. Holbrooks was 
dismissed from Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock Wednes-
day morning. Mrs. Ronald 
Henderson of Liberal, Kan. is 
still with them. Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom McGill visited with her 
in the hospital almost every 
day as he was taking treat-
ments. Rev. and Mrs. Ray-
mond Jones visited with her 
Tuesday, the Milburn 
Haydons last week. Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Wayne Hol-
brooks, Kara Mae and Johnny 
Lewis of White River Lake 
visited J. C. here and his 
mother in the hospital Tues-
day night. Chet Henderson of 
Liberal, Kan. visited with 
them last week and over the 
weekend. Kevin and Vicki 
Pace had dinner with them 
July 4. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Orr of 
Cisco visited Wednesday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Phelan and Rev. and 
Mrs. Raymond Jones. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ezell Sadler 
were in Clovis Monday after- 
noon to be with Mr. and Mrs. 
Cleo Widner of Melrose, 
while he underwent major 
surgery. They visited again 
Saturday with them. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Bowden 
visited with Eddie Guffee at 
the Llano Estacado Museum 
in Plainview Monday. 

Rev. and Mrs. Raymond 
Jones, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Phelan, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Hershel Wilson attended the 
Llanos Altos Men's Rally in 
the Memorial Baptist Church 
in Littlefield Tuesday night. 
It was family night and the 
speaker was Vaughn Ross, 
medical missionary to Kenya, 
now the missionary in 
residence at Wayland while 
home on furlough. 

Jerri Ka Clark won second 
place in Showmanship. 11th 
place in Western pleasure, 
and fourth place with her 
registered mare in the 5 and 
over division, in the Lamb 
County Horse Show last 
weekend. 

Gay Waggoner won first 
place in the Castro County 
dress review in the 9-11 year 
division Saturday. Camille 
Summers won alternate in the 
12-14 age group. Gay will 
represent the county in the 
district competition. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ciprano 
Saenz and family of Roma 
arrived Wednesday night to 
visit awhile with Mr. and 
Mrs. Milburn Haydon. They 
attended the church services 
with them Sunday. 

The church library commit-
tee kept the library open 
Thursday afternoon, and 
made plans for the annual 
summer reading club party. 

Senior Citizens' 
lunch menu 

Barbara Brooks 

Continental Telephone 
of Texas 

Doing our best to do more for %nu 

On NIoncla‘ July "th, 
we'll begin helping you 
with service requests. 
billing inquiries. trouble 
rep(ms. and ally other 
questions vou 111aV haVC 
allollt VOW' phone service. 

We're located in Dumas 
At Villa Mercado Shopping 
Center. Rut vou don't kn. e  
to drive here. \Ve can take 
care of your requests by 
phone from 9 a.m. to 
O 	NIondav through 
Friday. 

For service requests and 
billing inquiries. dial 
I + 	1. lb report 
tn milk. with your phone or 
to find Out who's On your 
party line. dial 
I + 93 5--1 h. Thou• calk 
are free from Continental 
Teleplu me exchanges. 

If vou have any prithleni 
with your plume service, 
please give us a Call. \\'e 
Wain 10 help solve your 
problem 

Save time and energy with RAPID ROOF®  
Conklin's RAPID ROOF is the elastomeric roofing system 
made to weatherproof a variety of roof decking substrates. The 
lightweight. yet rugged RAPID ROOF membrane is many times 
lighter than conventional built-in roofing. And, deck irregularities 
that might pose problems for seamed membranes are overcome 
with the RAPID ROOF monolithic system. 

Over new or remedial roofing, the lower installation costs 
of RAPID ROOF allow you to invest in quality materials, not 
expensive labor. You'll also get superior heat-reflectivity in natural 
white or choose from a variety of SHOW KOTE"" decorative 
cover tints. 

The RAPID ROOF system . . . 
your shield against the elements. 
Interested? Write or phone today. 

ROBERT DUKE 
1011 W. Lee St. 
Ph. (806) 647.5517 

MONDAY — Oven fried 
chicken with gravy, mashed 
sweet potatoes, canned 
spinach, roll, butter, choco-
late pudding, milk, tea, 
coffee. 

TUESDAY — Turkey, 
mixed vegetables, macaroni 
and cheese, roll, butter, 
orange whip, milk, tea, 
coffee. 

WEDNESDAY — Tacos, 
tossed salad, pinto beans, 
roll, butter, apricot halves, 
raisins, milk, tea, coffee. 

THURSDAY — Smoked 
sausage. sliced potatoes, 
green lima beans, roll, butter, 
sliced peaches, milk, tea, 
coffee. 

FRIDAY — Beef with 
gravy, potato salad, canned 
green peas. roll, butter, 
chocolate care, milk, tea, 
coffee. 



A HELPING, 
HAND 

Drive Friendly the recas way 

Nothing in Texas 
touches Du-TER 

When it comes to effective leafspot control in 
sugar beets, nothing touches DU-TER for control 
or convenience. 
• CLEAN AND EASY—Just open the outer bag and 

the water-soluble inner bag drops into the tank, 
leaving no bulky containers to dispose of. Dissolves 
quickly, sprays easily 

• ECONOMICAL—In Texas field trials, DU-TER plots 
produced the highest sugar yields. Yet, DU-TER 
spraying costs were lowest! 

• DEPENDABLE--In more than 10 years of use, 
leafspot has shown no known resistance to DU-TER. 

Ask your farm chemical supplier today 
for DU-TER fungicide. Nothing in 

Texas touches it. 	0.1959 

THOMPSOR HAYWARD 
CHEMICAL COMPANY 

FUNGICIDE 

DU-TER In Reg TM of 
Phlips-0011er B V. 
Amsterdam. Holland.  

• ',ORIN WIRKAN Pli11i05 — 
PO 80x 2383 
Kansas City. Kansas 56110 

DU-TER 

MARKETING• •  
What Is Your Responsibility? 

Now that your crop is up and growing, think a minure about 
your most important responsibility as a grain producer. 

How are you going to market your grain? 

How can you maximize the returns on your investment? If you 
are a competitive businessman, you want to have control over 
the pricing of your crop. You want to choose a marketing 
program that tits your individual operation. Confidence and 
trust in the merchandisers with whom you do business is 
important. The ideas of mass marketing and farmers having a 
voice in the marketplace appeal to you. 

These reasons are why area producers are taking their 
marketing responsibility seriously, participating in the pool 
marketing program at Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc. 

Call or come by today. Find out why grain producers are 
looking to their cooperative to expand markets and increase 
profits through pool marketing. Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc., 
is working for you and your responsibilities. 

AUGUST 15 is the sign-up 
DEADLINE for pool marketing! 

Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc. 
647-2141 
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Janice Ulmer schedules visit Nazareth 

`55 class holds reunion 
Janice Ulmer, Social Secur-

ity; Administration Represen-
tat4ve for this area, is avail- 

able for questions and 
answers the first and third 
Thursdays of each month 
from 10 a.m. to noon in the 
Castro County courthouse. 

Upcoming dates are July 
17, Aug. 7 and 21 and Sept. 4 
and 18. 

To file a claim for Social 
Security or Supplemental 
Security Income payments, 
call collect, station to station, 
806-293-4371. For assistance 
with other social security 
matters, call toll-free, 1-800-
392-1603. 

647-3123 For Printing 

from a couple weeks stay in 
the Dimmitt hospital. 

Vincent Pohlmeier is home 
after spending a week in 
Amarillo at a diagnostic clinic. 

the Albert Schultes and Greg 
Hoeltings. 

Our sympathy to Mrs. 
Lavern Wilhelm who returned 
home Thursday from Seenery 
Hill, Pa. after attending the 
funeral of her mother, Eliza-
beth Dorka, who passed away 
June 28. 

M. C. ADAMS, O.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 364-2255 

Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Morday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:30 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 

WHEN YOU REALLY NEED iT 

CRAIG AGENCY 
Insurance - Real Estate 

Dimmitt, Texas 79027 
Phone 647-4223 

Ronnie and Jo ISlavik) 
Braddock of Sterling, Colo. 
spent several days here with 
the John Slaviks and Rudolf 
Braddocks. 	Their children, 
Anita and Gary, have been 
visiting here with their grand-
parents for several weeks. 

Many young people from 
here enjoyed a long weekend 
at Lake Kemp, boating and 
skiing. 	Another group of 
couples from here enjoyed the 
weekend at Red River. 

Louie Schacher is home 

girls modeled the outfits that they had made 
through the 4-H program. County Extension 
Agent Teresa Criswell was in charge of the 
Revue which had 47 entrants. 

4-H DRESS REVUE—Winners in the recent 
Dress Revue were from left, Cara Odom, 
alternate, Tammy Behrends, Nancy Hatla, 
Gay Waggoner, Mary Jean Huseman, alter-
nate, and Camille Summers, alternate. The 

GRAND OPENING 	 

Family Fun Park 
and Restaurant 

Thursday, July 10 
101 West 5th 	 Plainview, Texas 

"Bringing the Family Together" 

Fun for All Ages, especially for the daring ones-- 

By MRS. VIRGIE GERBER 
The class of 1955 held a 

25th class reunion recently in 
the home of Don and Betty 
Acker. Those attending were 
Walter and Mary Acker of 
Bartlesville, Okla., Lloyd and 
Della Venhaus of Happy, 
Vincent Ehly of Canyon, Cecil 
and Norita Hoelting, Denny 
and Dolores Heiman, Gilbert 
and Dolly Schulte, Dickie and 
Bernice Hoelting and Carol 
and Mildred Birkenfeld, all of 
Nazareth. The evening was 
spent eating supper, looking 
at old and new pictures and 
talking over school days. It 
was thoroughly enjoyed by 
all. 

The families of Dan 
Schmucker, Gene Schmucker, 
Roger Schilling, Charley Hill, 
Jimmy Hoelting, Greg and 
Tinie Hoelting and Virgie 
Gerber enjoyed the 4th of July 
evening with the Ray 
Schmuckers. 

Charley and Bev Hill, Todd 
and Traci drove to McLean on 
Saturday 	and 	visited 
Charley's mother at the 
hospital in Shamrock. 

Carol Hoelting and her 
children of Denver, Colo., are 
visiting here with her parents, 4-H Dress Revue follows 

'Color Explosion' theme TOPS members 
hold meeting 

* Bumper Boats *"Wet Willie" Water Slide 

* Roller Coaster * Speed Boats * Surry Ride 

* Minature Golf * Amusement Arcade 

Twenty TOPS members 
weighed in Monday with a 
93/4  pound weight loss. 

Lady TOP loser was Karen 
Moss with a three pound loss. 
KOPS loser was Fay Varner. 

For the month of June, 
Oleta Raper was the Lady 
TOPS loser with a 71/2  pound 
loss. Durward Davis was the 
male TOPS loser with 83 4 
pounds loss. KOPS loser was 
Janice Bell and Angel of the 
Month was Gayle Ward., 

The six-month award night 
and monthly fellowship for 
June has been postponed 
until August 4. 

Discount on Rides and Golf during 

Grand Opening 

Golf 	  $1.00 
Wet Willie Slide 	 $2.00 

Bumper Boats 	 75' 

Flagg-Hart, Carla Summers, 
Gay Waggoner and Shannon 
Ott of Flagg and Denise 
Schulte of Easter. 

Red ribbon winners in the 
junior class 9-11 were Julie 
Hatla of Nazareth, Trisha 
Hufhines of Dimmitt, Tammy 
Leatherwood of Bethel and 
Cami Struve of Easter. 

The clothing leaders were 
Lanell Hanson, Oneida Hutto 
and Joyce Davis of Dimmitt, 
Wanda Nelson, Debbie Harris 
and Judy Waggoner of Flagg, 
Katherine Hochstein of 
Nazareth and Beverly Harder 
of Easter. 

The fashion revue commit: 
tee included Mildred Birken-
feld - and Beth Schulte of 
Nazareth, Charlene Hunter 
and Mildred Washington of 
Dimmitt, Judy Waggoner of 
Flagg. Retta Cox of Hart and 
Teresa Criswell, County Ex-
tension Agent. 

"Color Explosion" was the' 
theme for the Castro County 
4-H Dress Revue held Thurs-
day at the Fourth and Bedford 
Church of Christ Fellowship 
Hall. 47 entries were judged 
by Naomi Wheeler, Laura 
Jacobs, Kay Wells and Linda 
Mullin, County Extension 
Agent Teresa Criswell said. 

*Winners in each class were: 
Tammy Behrends of Easter, 

senior class; Nancy Hatla of 
Nazareth, junior class 12-14; 
and Gay Waggoner of Flagg, 
junior class 9-11. 

Alternates were: Mary Jean 
Huseman of Nazareth, senior 
class; Camille Summers of 
Flagg, junior class 12-14; and 
Cara Odom of Dimmitt, junior 
class 9-11. 

Honorary 4-1-Vers who won 
blue ribbons were Shelly 
LeAnn Knox of Flagg-Hart 
and Kara Schulte and Kylia 
Struve of Easter. 

Blue ribbon winners in the 
senior class included Tammy 
Behrends of Easter, Janet 
Huseman and Mary Jean 

Kiddie Rides 	  35' 

Huseman of Nazareth. Red 
ribbon winners were Edith 
Durbin of Nazareth, Linda 
Hernandez and Mary Ann 
Hernandez of Easter and 
Karen Huseman of Nazareth. 

In the junior class 12-14, 
blue ribbon winners were 
Patsy Birkenfeld, Nancy Hatla 
and Ramona Heiman of 
Nazareth, Shirley Hanson, 
Jill Nelson, Jan Nelson and 
Sheryl Simpson of Dimmitt, 
Teresa Jackson and Kay 
Owen of Flagg-Hart and 
Camille Summers of Flagg. 

Red ribbon winners of the 
junior class were Dorothy 
Durbin, 'Celia Kern, Kris 
Kern and Joan Robel of 
Nazareth, Holly Waggoner of 
Flagg, and Tammy Washing-
ton of Dimmitt. 

In junior class 9-11, blue 
ribbon winners were Melissa 
Brockman. Traci Hill, Bobbi 
Hochstein and Barbie Steffens 
of Nazareth, Sue Crozier, 
Charlynn Hunter. Shelly Nutt, 
Cara Odom and Kim Wash-
ington of .Dimmitt, Cindy 
Knox, Judy Ann Mauk, Gwen 
Wilson and Melinda Wilson of When I need to gain weight 

I PUT IT ON 
[Compiled from the Commun-
ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth 
American Legion Auxiliary.) 

JULY 10 — Lavon Reeve, 
Joyce Rickerd, Renee 
Sanders, Pam White, Robert 
Ryan, Anna D. Gibbs. Doris 
Hatla, Jennifer Brockman, 
Debbie Schilling. 

JULY 11 — Doug Wilhelm, 
Lynn Wagner, Ashley 
Hoelting, Rafael Vasqus, Jr., 
David Lynn Hutson, Jeff 
Robertson, Gary Baldridge, 
Frances Goodwin, Verbie 
Nelson, Rayphard Smithson. 

JULY 12 — KaKa Bruegel, 
Steve 

Gerber, 

Delicious 
-Dra4  Supplement  For 

,  Nutritious 
weight Gain Program' 

VANKLA PLAV011  

NET *Err  32  013 I2.8114.11  

Jan 	Hargrove, 
Lunsford, Tricia 
Walter Kleman. 

JULY 13 — Jean Dulaney, 
Jeanne Davis, Ron Ballard, 
Jeannie Evan. 

JULY 14 — Sid Sageser, 
Brad Holcomb, Mark Strick-
land. Coby Summers, Scott 
Hays, Tonya Clark, Brad 
DuLaney, Clinton Acker, Don 
Acker, Lillian Venhaus. 

JULY 15 — Tracy Maurer, 
Ethel Schmucker, LeRoy 
Pohlmeier, Evelyn Ball, Brent 
Wilhelm, Curtis Durbin, 
Christine Wilhelm, Gloria 
Mason. Kent Birdwell, Noel 
Gollehon. 

JULY 16 — Glenn Lust, Pat 
Bagley, Ricky Rickerd, Karen 
Nelson, Jewel Spencer, 
Carmen Gonzales, Charles 
Braddock. 	 

But for those who 
need to LOSE WEIGHT 

HCA helps you take it off! 
Whether you re gaining weight or losing weight. you can trust HCA's nutri• 
tionally complete dietary products to help you get the results you're look-
ing for. Take if off or put it on — HCA makes it simple and safe with pro-
ducts specially formulated with your good health and nutritional needs in 
mind. There's an HCA product that's just right for you. Call us. well tell you 
all about it. 

Everyone is invited to a Meeting Friday, July 11 at 1:30 p.m. 
Dimmitt City Hall Assembly Room 

All HCA products ar- 	 aro 	 guaranteed or money back. 

Hershel & Retha Wilson, Ph. 647-5669 
Gertie Waggoner, Ph. 647-5762 
Ann Cox, Ph. 647-5314 
Merton Powell, Ph. 647-5328 

Now Leasing 

WEST TEXAS 

MINI-STORAGE 

Lock It & Leave It 

647-1427 or 
296-6372 

Dorothy Nutt, Ph. 647-4393 
Henrietta Nazworth, Ph. 647.2569 
Ysleta Ball, Ph. 647-3140 
Lillian Carson, Ph. 647-5768 



Public Notice 
1 Southwestern Bell, in accordance 

with the rules of the Public Utility Com-
mission of Texas, hereby gives notice 
of the company's intent to implement a 
new schedule of telephone rates in 
Texas effective August 12.1980, unless 
otherwise determined by the Commis-
sion 

It is expected that the requested rate 
schedule will furnish an 11 65 percent 
increase in the company's intrastate 
revenues. 

A complete copy of the new rate 
schedule is on file with the Public Utility 
Commission at Austin, Texas, and with 
each affected municipality, and is 
available for inspection in each of the 
company's public business offices in 
Texas. 

Southwestern Bell 

di 

WE LEASE: 
• TRACTORS 
• COMBINES 
• COTTON STRIPPERS 

AGRICULTURAL
INTERNATIONAL 
	 HAYS 

EQUIPMENT 

IMPLEMENT CO. 

HARMAN'S BIG Ladies Ladies Free Spirit 

BRAS 20% OFF CLOG SANDALS $49p9.-. 

SANDALS 
Ladies Hi Heel Bare Back 

Values $0 67 
kfi Pr. to '12" Men's & Boy's 

Short Sleeve 
Values 

$299  to '5" GIRL'S SPORTSWEAR Spring & Summer 

TOPS GALORE 

Box's Knit 

SHIRTS 
i%Iens Western 

Men's knit 

SPORT 
SHIRTS 

V OFF 
3 

SHIRTS Now $899  
Short Sleeves 1/4„ OFF 

/ 6 The Regular Price! 

SHORTS & PANTS 
is Lo% 1. 

$3999 

Men's Texas Brand 

COWBOY 
BOOTS 

BIG SELECTION! 
BIG SA VINGS! 

SHIRTS 
1/3  OFF / 

o • ir riceI  
Tonv Lama Sharkskin 

COWBOY 
BOOTS Beg  

Men's Spring & Summer 
\ In% On Ix 

$ 7999 
$9999 

l%Ien's Short Sleetses 	Noli 

SPORT SHIRTS $799 
Values to 8 13" 

Dress & Casual 
PANTS 

1/3  OFF 

The Regular 

Price! 

I he Regular Price: 

*DRESSES *TOPS it 
*PANTS 	*SHORTS 

()LT THEY 
GO!! V OFF 

Saxe Noxi!: 	/ 3  Regular Price! Men's HARMAN'S 
TREMENDOUS £4 VINGS! 

1)1R1NG HARMAN'S 
JULI CLEARANCE! 

lb OFF  
it, The Regular 

BLOUSES 
& SKIRTS 

1/c. OFF 

N,  

,a e 2 	
3 Piece 1/4  OFF 

SUITS " 	
in DIMMITT 

Save Nols:! 	WHERE THE CLEARANCE ACTION IN! SUMMER SPORTS WEAR 

THE CASTRO COUNTY NEWS, DIMMITT, TEXAS Page 13 Thursday, July 10, 	1980 

Teresa's topks 

Mushrooms are answer 
for low-calorie diet 

MINOR LEAGUE CHAMPS—The Rangers ended the season 
with a 7-2 record to capture the first place position in the 
Dimmitt Minor League. Kneeling, from left, are Wayne 
Schacher, Adrian Falcon, Jeffery Long, Curtis Ward and Jason 
Long. Standing, from left, are Donald Martinez, Curt 

Summers, Matt Bradley, Chad Yokum, Jason Smotherman and 
Kelly Howell. Coaches Jim Long and Dick Schacher stand 
behind the winning team that was selected to play against 
Nazareth. 

Learning, communication 
depends on proper speech 

letter to the editor 

Young man vows 
'I'll not register' 

By TERESA L. CRISWELL 
County Extension Agent 
Havy you been looking for a 

low calorie food for the 
summer? Mushrooms may be 
a vegetable you haven't 
thought about. A full pound 
of mushrooms contains only 
about 125 calories; a cup of 
sliced, only about 25 calories. 

When shopping for fresh 
mushrooms look for firm, 
smooth, fresh appearing. 
mushrooms. The membrane 
(veil) underneath the cap may 
or may not be intact. If it is 
pulled away from the stem it 
simply indicates some 
moisture loss. Such mush-
rooms are actually preferred 
in England and Europe 
because they have more 
concentrated flavor. 

Mushrooms will keep in the 
refrigerator a week to ten 
days. 	However, if they 
become soft, discolored, and 
have a slippery surface they 
are not usable. 

Mushrooms come in various 
colors, but inside they are all 
pearly white. 	Flavor and 
texture are the same. 

Refrigerate mushrooms in 
their original container. 
Holes for ventilation are 
provided in the overwrap of 
packaged mushrooms. If you 
have bought them loose they 
may be stored in a paper bag. 

Canned mushrooms are 
available in sliced, stems and 
pieces, and whole button 
packs. The label shows 
drained weight, the exact 
amount of usable mushroom 
you are buying. There is no 
waste. 

HEARTY MUSHROOM 
SUPPER SALAD 

1 pound fresh mushrooms 
'2 cup salad oil 
3 tablespoons lemon juice 
12  teaspoon minced garlic 
'z teaspoon sugar 
1 teaspoon salt 
1/8 teaspoon ground black 

pepper 

Bruegel family, Ron Easley, 
Jack Patton and Walter 
Spinhirne for their work 
during the sales. 

"It was a job well done, 
and the entire club deserves a 
pat on the back.-  said Davis. 

Model 5800 Rounder 
Big-capacity baling from 
a truly reliable machine. 

ACCORDING to the U.S. 
Treasury Dept.. the average 
one-dollar bill in circulation 
will be worn out and replaced 
in 18 months. 

Nutrient-rich crop reNktues tall be haled with 
the Hesston 58(10 Rounder. Pim erful feeding 
action of the timed steel compression roller 
and other features throughout the unit make 
this possible. 

If you're looking for a top-performing, high- 
capacity round baler, take a closer look at the im-

proved 5500 from Hesston. 

Today's Machine at Yesterday's Price 

Lettuce leaves 
1  2 	pound sliced cooked 

barn, slivered 
1  2 pound sliced Cheddar 

cheese, slivered 
4 hard-cooked eggs. sliced 
2 tomatoes, quartered 
Rinse, pat dry and slice 

mushrooms (makes about 
5-' 2 cups); place in a bowl. 
Combine oil, lemon juice, 
garlic, sugar, salt and black 
pepper. Pour over mush- 
rooms; toss well. 	On a 
lettuce-lined platter arrange 
in clusters, mushrooms, ham, 
cheese, eggs and tomatoes. 
Sprinkle with remaining 
dressing from mushrooms. 

YIELD: 6 portions 
MUSHROOM CHICKEN 

STIR-U P 
1 pound fresh mushrooms 

or 2 cans (6 to 8 oz. each) 
sliced mushrooms 

6 tablespoons butter or 
margarine 

1 quart sliced cabbage 
1 green pepper, sliced 
1 onion, sliced 
1 can (10-1  1 oz.) condensed 

chicken broth 
2 tablespoons cornstarch 
2 tablespoons soy sauce 
1  2 teaspoon ground ginger 
2 cups diced cooked 

chicken, turkey, pork or 
shrimp 

Rinse, pat dry and slice 
fresh mushrooms (makes 
about 5-'2 cupsl or drain 
canned mushrooms. In a 
large skillet melt butter. Add 
mushrooms, cabbage, green 
pepper and onion. Cook and 
stir for 5 minutes. Combine 
remaining ingredients except 
chicken. Pour over vegeta-
bles. Add checken. Cook and 
stir until vegetables are crisp-
tender and the sauce is slight-
ly thickened, 2 to 3 minutes. 
Serve over rice or noodles, if 
desired. 

YIELD: 4 to 6 portions 

DRAWING on my fine 
command of language, I said 
nothing. 

Your chances 
of dying 
from a heart attack 
or stroke are 50-50. 

t American Heart Association 

South Nazareth Farm Store 
South Highway 168, Nazareth Phone 945.2225 

"Without proper speech 
you can't communicate, you 
can't learn and you can't 
establish 	relationships," 
Teresa Bruegel, a speech 
pathologist, told Kiwanis Club 
members Monday. 

Ms. Bruegel discussed the 
different types of problems 
that cause speech defects, 
such as cleft palate and 
cerebral palsy. 

She also talked about the 
use of rhythm devices to cure 
the problems of people who 
stutter or clutter their words. 

"People like Mel Tillis can 
sing clearly, although they 
cannot talk clearly because 
the music has a beat that they 
can follow for the flow of their 
speech," she said. 

Ms. Bruegel is working on 
her masters in speech pathol-
ogy which will enable her to 
work in private as well as 
public schools. 

In regular business Mon-
day, Jimmy Davis gave the 
final report on the sales of 
fireworks for the 4th of July. 
Kiwanians netted almost 
$3,000 from the sales. Special 
recognition was given to the 

4.0-001.0.42,40*-01-•mrteinistireerariesafa'sendruOsiesse•reeies0  

means. 
Thus, if my government 

asks me if I am willing to kill 
other human beings in the 
defense of Persian oil fields or 
in the defense of our nation 
when more appropriate and 
peaceful solutions have not 
been pursued to the ultimate, 
then I must say, "No, I will 
not kill. No, I will not fight. 
No, I will not register." 

MARK WELCH 

DANCE 
featuring 

LAST OF A KIND 
Saturday, July 12th 

'3" person 

Members & Guests Welcome 

CANDLELIGHT CLUB 
208 S.E. 4th 	 Dimmitt 

Dear Editor; 
Barring success by the 

American Civil Liberties 
Union to have the recently 
passed draft registration 
legislation ruled unconstitu-
tional, it appears that Presi-
dent Carter will succeed in 
requiring all male youths born 
in 1960 and 1961 to appear at 
their local post offices later 
this month to formally give 
their consent to the Selective 
Service System to be drafted. 
Even though no draft is 
threatening at this time, 
registration for this purpose 
calls for all those directly 
involved to search themselves 
for 	their 	appropriate 
response. 

Being 22 years old, I fall 
within the legal range of the 
draft even though I am not 
required to register at this 
time. But before the age limit 
was announced. I too, was 
faced with making a decision 
about military service. 	I 
speak of a decision, of a 
choice involved here. It is not 
an easy choice. The penalty 
for non-registration is a 
maximum 	five 	years' 
imprisonment and/or $10,000 
fine. On the surface, the 
choice is simple. 	After all, 
there is no draft at this time. 
Who in their right mind would 
risk the possibility of a long 
prison sentence and heavy 
financial fine when all that is 
asked is the filling out of a 
simple form? 

But the problem lies much 
deeper. All that I have been 

taught by my family and by 
my church concerning the 
nature of our lives and the 
value of human existence has 
led me to believe that I cannot 
best fulfill my purposes in life 
by being trained to kill other 
human beings. 	Especially 
innocent persons drug into 
the same ungodly war in 
which I would find myself. 
For me to consent to registra-
tion would be to abandon the 
principles by which I try to 
live my life and allow the 
military aristocracy to replace 
them with their own values of 
death and destruction. 

It seems that whenever our 
national security is threatened 
we automatically turn to 
military solutions. The 
powerful options of economic 
suasion, peer pressure of 
neighbor nations, patience, 
and a genuine concern for the 
citizens of all other lands, east 
and west, communist and 
noncommunist, rich and poor, 
have never been seriously and 
rigorously tested. 

I have faith that these 
peaceful means would do 
more to develop the interests 
of national security more so 
than any stockpile of nuclear 
weapons. For we would not 
be hypocritically promoting 
peace by preparing for war, 
but would be demonstrating 
to the world that the United 
States of America is willing to 
lead the way in creating a 
peaceful world the only way 
that it can ever hope to be 
achieved—through peaceful 



METRIC BOLTS 
at 

Hays Implement Co. 

vIrsi,,Amietp; 
• 

• Arrangements 

• Monuments 
• Pre-Need Policies Dimmitt 

-- 

firestone 

721 Steel Belted Radial 
Special Offer  

235/75R '15 Black Blemish 

Or $4800  
While supply lasts 

plus tax 

Ideal for pickups 

Michelin XWW Radial 
205 x 14 	 '80" plus tax 

$ 8500 plus tax 215 x 14 	  
205 x 15 	  $8300 plus tax 

215 x 15 , 	 $8600 plus tax 

225 x 15 	  $9000 plus tax 

230 x 15 	  s10700 plus tax 

235 x 15 , 	 109" plus tax 

Hi-Plains Oil Co., Inc. 

l'imionmatellIOUM.••••1".••••1100,••••••••1104•11 " 	 

Thank You 
for your terrific response to 

our Summer Clearance Sale! 

We still have a few shoes and 
sandals in stock which we must 
clear out by August 1. So we're 
cutting prices even further! 

60% Off 
on Connies, Thos. Con, Johansen, 

Nina and Sbicca 

50% OFF 
on Aigner sandals! 

Special $5 Table 

Klonks, $5 
Handbags Half Price! 

Me Sim het 
Jimmie and Lynn Schulte 

647-5215 119 E. Bedford 
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Hance to speak on patriotism 
holiday recess from Congress, 
according to Rev. John Street, 
pastor. 

Congressman Kent Hance 
will deliver a patriotic 
message to the First Baptist 
Church in Dimmitt on 
Sunday, July 13 at 11 a.m. 

Hance will speak in 
connection with the July 4th 

THE common housefly 
beats its wings about 185 
times in one second. 

JUNIOR HIGH CHAMPS—Members of the 
Junior High team which captured the state 
Amateur Trap Shooting Association title and 
will compete in the District 4-H Trap Shoot 

of the team, from left, are: Lynn West, 
coach, Robert Boozer, Doug Schilling, Todd 
Hatla, Kent Kirby, Adrian Stanton and Ed 
Standlee, coach. 

Wednesday in Lubbock are, from left: Lynn 
West, coach; Mark Standlee, Mike Stanford, 
Robbie Hottel, Todd West, Tim Kenworthy 
and Ed Standlee, coach. 

SENIOR HIGH TEAM—Members of the 
Senior High team which captured  the Texas 
State Amateur Trap Shooting title recently 
hold their championship plaques. Members 

Square dancers enjoy Trap shooting teams 
Nazareth festival 	to compete Wednesday 

Two Dimmitt teams that 
captured the Texas State 
Amateur Trap Shooting 
Association titles last month 
will compete Wednesday in 
the District 2 4-H Trap Shoot 
in Lubbock. 

The teams will compete 
against other teams from 20 
South Plains Counties at the 
South Plains Gun Club. 

Members are currently 
working on money-making 

Entry fees vary according to 
events, coach Ed Standlee 
said. 

projects to fund their trip to 
the Amateur Trap Shooting 
Association's Grand American 
Shoot in Vandalia, Ohio Aug. 
20. Teams from across the 
nation and from other 
countries will compete during 
the shoot, 

A turkey shoot has been 
scheduled for Sunday, July 27 
at the Dimmitt Trap Range. 
The shoot will begin at 1 p.m. 
and is open to the public. 

A bake sale sponsored by 
team member's mothers will 
be held July 23 at Dimmitt 
Supermarket. An assortment 
of baked goods will be sold 
and individuals who wish to 
donate items to the bake sale 
can call Diane Hatla at 
647-3349. 

The Nazareth Kurlie Q's 
had their regular square 
dance in connection with the 
German Folk Festival on June 
28. The round dances started 
at 1 p.m. and were called by 
Les and Alberta Grumke. 
Square dancing started at 2 
p.m. with the grand march, 
called by Harrick Allen. 

Guests included people 
from, Bairne, Amarillo, 
Dimmitt, Hart, Lubbock, 
Tuba, and Hereford. Out-of-
state guests included people 
from Waterflow, N.M., 
Plains, Kansas and Santa 
Clara, Calif. There were also 
guests from Germany, the 
Netherlands, Sweden, 
Belgium and Panama Altos 
del Galf. 

Over 100 guests watched 
the dance. 

"We want to thank all the 
club members and visitors for 
making the dance a big 
success,-  said Mrs. Nathan 
Pevehouse. 

At the regular dance held 
on July 6, two squares danced 
to the calling of Harrick Allen. 
Refreshments were served by 
Bill and Ann Henderson. 
New club members are Char-
ley and Edith Graef and John 
and Doris Wait, all of 
Dimmitt. Guests included 
Jim and Dena Peggram and 
Wanda Marble. 

The Nazareth Kurlie Q's 
dance on the first, third, and 
fifth Sundays of each month 
at 8 p.m. at the American 
Legion Hall in Nazareth. 

"The door is always open 
for new members and 
visitors." said Mrs. Peve-
house. 

Social Security 
in 

Castro County 

By JANICE B. ULMER 

July! 	Half of 1980 is 
history and we have six 
months left to accomplish all 

• those New Year's resolutions. 
. Quite a sobering thought, 
isn't it? 

Actually, July is a good 
month for a general review of 
priorities. This is especially 
true for people who receive 
social security checks and who 
are working. During the first 
quarter of the year, working 
beneficiaries reported their 
previous year's earnings and 
estimated their 1980 earnings. 
It may be that a person has 
earned more or less than he 
or she expected and this could 
affect social security checks. 

The general rule is that a 
person can receive all checks 
for the year if earnings do not 
exceed the annual exempt 
amount. 	This year this 
amount is $5,000 for people 
65 and older, and S3,720 for 
people under 65. If earnings 
exceed the annual exempt 
amount. the SI in benefits is 
withheld for each $2 of 
earnings above the limit. 

We are able to make adjust-
ments in a person's estimate 
at almost any time. It is most 
beneficial if there is a signifi- 

1.! 

cant variation in the gross,  
(Not net) earnings, because 
we still have six months to 
avert possible overpayment or 
underpayment. 

Just a couple of reminders, 
this earnings test applies only 
to people under 72. Also if 
this is your first year of 
retirement, you may be 
eligible for a check any month 
you earn less than the 
monthly limit or do very little 
work in self-employment. 
The monthly limit is $417 for 
people 65-and over, and 5310 
for people under 65. 

You can report any change 
in your earnings by calling 
our toll-free number, 1-800- 
392-1603. 	If you have a 
medicare claim question call 
1-800-442-2620. 	Or if you 
would like to file a claim call 
our office collect 293-4371. 
We will be glad to help you in 
person, but if a phone call is 
convenient for you, it can save 
you time, energy and money. 

HORSES bring unclear 
views into focus by changing 
the angle of their heads. In 
humans, the lens of the eye 
changes shape.  

We're having our -1  
Summer Sale! 
Summerwear 

40% Off 
City Girl  

40% Off 
All Jeans  

20% Off 
THE 

JEAN TREE 
Sugarland Mall 

Apply your Roundup herbicide with 

BOBAR Brand 
ROPE WICK APPLICATORS 

* Available for Front or Rear Mount 

* 6-Row, 8-Row, 8-Row Foldup Models 

Don Moore 
	 Richard Connell 

647.3418 
	

647-2526 



a. 

Caison's Bar-Blue 
Featuring 

TEXAS B111141111 
Choice of Chicken, Ham, Sausage, Beef, and Pork Ribs 
plus...all the trimmings & fixin's like homemade potato 
salad, tole slaw, pinto beans and tasty desserts to fill 
you to the brim... 	Only $250  

THE COUNTRY FOUR 
will be entertaining 

Saturday Night 7 to 9 p.m. 

Open Mon. thru Sat. - 11 a.m.-8:30 p.m. — Sun., 11 a.m. -2 p.m. 

Yaill Come! 
828 W. 1st. Hereford, Tex. 

Ernest Brown 
Services for Ernest R. 

Brown, 87, father of Clifford 
Brown of Dimmitt, were held 
at 10 a.m. Tuesday in 
Lubbock's Resthaven Chapel 
with Rev. J. Waid Griffin, 
associate pastor of the First 
United Methodist Church 
officiating. 

Burial was in Resthaven 
Memorial Park under the 
direction of Resthaven 
Funeral Home. 

Brown died at 6:57 a.m. 
Sunday after a short' illness. 

The Stonewall County 
native married Evelyn. Hays in 
Aspermont May 7, 1925. A 
Lubbock resident for 36 years, 
he was a member of Asbury 
Methodist Church. He was a 
World War I veteran. 

He is survived by his wife, 
two sons, Hylton of Plainview 
and Clifford of Dimmitt; a 
daughter, Dortha Woodward 
of Lubbock; two brothers, Bill 
of Abernathy and J.M. of 
Lovington, N.M.; a sister, 
Callie Nunn of Abernathy; six 
grandchildren and three 
great grandchildren. 

For All of Your 

PLUMBING 
NEEDS 

Call 
DEAN KIRBY 

647-4594 Dimmitt 
605 W.Cleveland 

LEON SANDOVAL 
201 S. Broadway 

* OPEN SEVEN DAYS A WEEK 
7 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

* FULL SERVICE a- 
Tire Service Car Wash 

Oil Change 	 Lubrication 

Upholstery and Carpet Shampoo 

* Yes, we wash all windshields! 
We also pick up and deliver 

SANDOVAL TEXACO 
201 S. Broadway 647-5722 

Announcing a new Texaco dealer: 

CENTRAL PLAINS 
SAVINGS 

ASSOCIATION 
•	  

HIGHER RATES PAID THAN 

ANY COMMERCIAL BANK 

	• 	  

21/2  YEAR CERTIFICATE 
$500 Minimum 

9.50% 
COMPOUNDED DAILY YIELDS 

9.965%  	• 
BIG SIX 

8.614 
6 MONTH MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATE 

$10,000 Minimum 

FEDERAL REGULATIONS REQUIRE A 

SUBSTANTIAL PENALTY FOR 
EARLY WITHDRAWAL 

216 N. Broadway 2804 Olton Rd. 
647.2118 	293-2607 
DIMMITT 	HAMM, 

200 N. Maxwell 	707 Main 	416 Mein 
995-3521 	839-2446 	823-2056 
TUUA 	HALE CENTER 	SILVERTON 
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Police calls NEXT to the elephant, thL 
hippopotamus is the heaviest 
of all land mammals. The 
weight of a hippo can exceed 
four tons. 

day. The first incident 
occurred at 1:00 a.m., the 
second at 7:45 p.m. and the 
third at 10:54 p.m. at the Star 
Dance Hall in Dimmitt. 

Obituaries  I 
Thursday, July 10, 1980  

ACCORDING to scientific 
studies, in an eight hour 
period of sleep a person will 
spend only an hour and 
twenty minutes dreaming, on 
the average.  

APPROXIMATELY one 
million couples divorce every 
year in the United States. 
Also, there are another one.  
million permanent separations 
and desertions each year. 

THE First American presi-
dent to ride in an automobile 
was Theodore Roosevelt. The 
first American president to 
drive a car himself was 
Warren G. Harding. 

Frances Guajardo Aubrey Guy Baton 

Seth Guajardo 
Services for Aubrey Guy 

Barton, 71, stepbrother of Ted 
Wood of Dimmitt, were held 
Tuesday at 2:30 in the First 
United Methodist Church of 
McLean with Rev. Joe 
Walker, pastor, officiating. 
Burial followed in the Hill-
crest Cemetery under the 
direction of Lamb Funeral 
Home. 

Mr. Barton died Saturday. 
Born in what is now Foss, 

Okla., he moved from McLean 
to Pampa in 1972. 	He 
married Fayette Bell Cope-
land in Clovis in 1941. 

Mr. Barton was a retired 
gauger with the Northern 
Natural Gas Company. He 
was a member of the First 
United Methodist Church and 
the Lions Club. 

He is survived by his wife; 
a sister, Gladys Barton of 
Amarillo; three stepbrothers, 
James 0. Wood of Chickasha, 
Okla., Ted Wood of Dimmitt 
and Roy A. Wood of Dill City, 
Okla., and two grandchildren. 

We Repair 
All Sizes 

I
Hydraulic Hose. 

Hays Implement Co. 

Plainview 
Overhead 

Door 

Genie 
Garage Door 

Openers 

mes 
DON TERRELL 

Manager 

° RESIDENTIAL 
° SALES 

JACK W. MORRIS 
Sales Manager 

COMMERCIAL 

° SERVICE 
Day 293-8577 Night 

3014 DIMMITT HWY. PLAINVIEW 

A 19 inch Admiral color 
television was stolen last 
week from the Colonial Inn 
Motel, according to city 
police. The motel manager 
noticed one of the rooms was 
unlocked and discovered the 
missing television. Police are 
searching for suspects who 
were reportedly staying in the 
room. They work for a 
Plainview firm, police said. 

Charges of reckless damage 
and destruction were filed 
against a Dimmitt youth Sun-
day when he batted a fly ball 
into the street and it struck 
the windshield of an 
oncoming car. A 1969 Chevy 
Nova owned by Mrs. Maria 
Gonzales suffered a broken 
windshield. The youth's 
father will reportedly pay for 
the damage. 

Two men, one from Here-
ford and one from Dimmitt, 
were arrested early Monday 
morning and charged with 
driving while intoxicated. 
The first incident occurred at 
1:14 a.m. and the second at 
1:48 a.m. The Dimmitt man 
was sentenced to 30 days in 
jail and was given a $300 fine. 

Three men were charged 
with public intoxication Satur- 

Services for Frances Qua-
jardo, 26, of Hereford, daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Florencil 
Vasquez of Dimmitt, and her 
six-week old son Seth, were 
held Saturday morning at the 
Spanish Assembly of God 
Church in Hereford, with Rev. 
Hector Sanchez, pastor, 
officiating. 

Burial was held in the 
Restlawn Memorial Park, 
under the direction of Rix 
Funeral Home of Hereford. 

Mrs. Guajardo died at 7:55 
a.m. Thursday at Deaf Smith 
General Hospital in Hereford 
from injuries suffered in a 
car-truck accident south of 
Hereford. Her son died at 
9:45 a.m. Thursday at North-
west Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo as a result of the 
same accident. 

Mrs. Guajardo had lived in 
Hereford seven months, after 
moving from Del Rio. She 
was a member of the Spanish 
Assembly of God Church in 
Hereford. 

She is survived by her 
parents; her husband, 
Richard; four sisters Rose 
Vasquez, Terry Vasquez and 
Ruth Vasquez, all of Dimmitt, 
and Connie Rivero of Del Rio; 
five brothers, Jessie Vasquez 
and Peter Vasquez of Del Rio, 
Robert Vasquez and Eddie 
Vasquez of Dimmitt, and 
Tony Vasquez of Hereford; 
and her great-grandparents of 
Mexico. 

The infant was born in 
Hereford. In addition to his 
mother's. survivors, he is 
survived by his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Feliciano 
Acevedo of Del Rio. 

Ruby Anna Shipley 
Services for Ruby Anna 

Shipley, 81, of Lubbock, 
former Dimmitt resident, will 
be at 10 a.m. today (Thurs-
day) in the Sanders Memorial 
Chapel in Lubbock, with Rev. 
Dr. Charles A. Taylor, pastor 
of First Presbyterian Church 
officiating, and Rev. J. T. 
Bolding, retired Baptist 
minister, assisting. 

Burial will be in the City of 
Lubbock Cemetery under the 
direction of Sanders Funeral 
Home. 

She died at noon Tuesday 
in Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock after a short illness. 

She had lived in Dimmitt 
for 13 years, before moving to 
Lubbock 35 years ago. 

Survivors include a daugh-
ter Sara Jo Smith of Buffalo 
Springs Lake; three sisters, 
Katherine Canaday of Era, 
Lyda Horton of Valley View, 
Nancy Jane Shirley of Denton; 
a brother Henry Roberson of 
Era: and two grandchildren. 

Antoinette Tierce 
Services for Antoinette 

(Toni) Tierce, 45, were held in 
the First Methodist Church of 
Hart Tuesday morning with 
Lanny Wheeler, pastor, 
officiating. 

Interment followed at Hart 
Cemetery under the direction 
of Parsons Funeral Home of 
Dimmitt. 

• • • 

Mrs. Tierce was pro-
nounced dead about 4:30 a.m. 
Sunday in her home by Jus-
tice of the Peace Marshall 
Young, who is withholding a 
ruling pending autopsy 
results. 

She was an employee of 
Panhandle Community Action 
group, and was a former 
Lubbock resident. 

I have purchased the interest of my partner, E. L. Ivey, and am now the sole 
owner of the Ivey Agency. 

I have been associated with the Ivey Agency since 1973. I received my agent's 
license four years ago, and have been a partner in the agency since 1977. 

I intend to continue with the same dependable insurance service as you have 
been accustomed to receiving from the Ivey Agency for the past 31 years. 

The Ivey Agency offers complete insurance coverage — homeowners, 
commercial, life, health, crop, robbery, theft, bonds. I look forward to serving 
you. 

She is survived by her 
husband, Richard Dale; her 
mother, Martha Bauman of 
Hart: a sister, Patsy Warren 
of Hart; and a brother, Joseph 
Bauman of Plainview. 

Pallbearers were Paul 
Catoe, Raleigh Strother, 
Laurence McLain, Joe Percy 
Hart, Bill Hill and Calvin 
Alexander. 

SOME idea of inflation 
comes from seeing a young-
ster get his first job at a 
salary you dreamed of as the 
culmination of your career. ThethutSittillt 

The Ivey Agency 
210 W. Bedford 	 647-3518 or 647-3422 
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A Small Down Payment Will 
Hold Your Purchase 30 Days. 

60" Stretch Terry 

1 97  yd. 

4-6x 6 8.8  2 FOR 5 13 1 I 

Girl's Dresses 	II 

7.14 0 88  2 FOR 5 16 

Sweet dresses for sweet girls! We've 

got a large selection of many charm- 

1 1  

t 1 
ing styles for back to school Buy 

her a whole new wardrobee al 	0 

these low prices! 

Summer's favorite fabric...terrv! Ours 

is made of polyester and cotton for 

a cool, soft look and feel. On full 

bolls, it comes in a variety of bright 

summer colors. Reg. 2.99 and 3.99 yd 

Girls' Jeans 

6 88  

• 
If she loves leans, she'll love our super assort-

ment! They're made of polyester-cotton blends 

for super fit and easy care. Plus. they have many. 

many fashion pocket designs to choose from. Reg. 

9.99 - 1199. 

Hanes" 

Briefs and T Shirts 

6 for 58 
He'll feel good all under in Hanes ! Briefs 

and T-shirts are 100% cotton for coolness 

and durability. In While only, sizes 3-20.  

Anthony's 

Briefs and T-Shirts 

"Fastbak" Shoes 
98.8 

Tube Socks 
Gel on the move in Fastbaks Anthony's exclusive athletic shoe. 

Sturdy nylon and *ether construction makes them perfect for 
your active life Choose from Navy or Brown in men's sizes 

6'2 	12. boys' 2'2 - 6, youths' 11-12 Reg. Men's - 12.99 
boys, - 1199, youths' - 10.99, 

6 6 FOR S5 and 6 FOR s4 
for '8 

A great value' These heavy duly tube socks come in 
Wnite with accent strives. Wear 'em for sports or 

casual wear. One size tits a-13. 

,.s easier wit, 

He can always use more quality underwear.. .so 

stock up now on Anthony's own brand,  Made of a 

Kodel -  and cotton belnd, they're soft and durable. 

Briefs have a wide elastic waistband and reinforced 

seams Sizes S.M,L,XL. Reg. 3 for 4.69. KodQI 
polyester 

master charge 
THE INTERBANK CARD 

I 

VISA 
vegraleaMZIMOIL 

WELCOME! Women's Sport 

Casuals 

14 8.8  
The PERFECT shoes for leans! These ladies' 

casual shoes and boots are suede for a rich 

look and feel. In Cinnamon, Rust and Almond, 

sizes 5-10. Men's Shirts 
7 8.8 

Girl's Tops 

44.4 8.8  2 fors9 

7-14 5 8.8  2 forsi 1 it 
The tops for her are at Anthony's! Our big\ 

selection features many Popular styles and colors 
in easy care fabric blends. You'll find great 

fashion at great  prices! 

2 FOR 5 14 

P El 11 BAs 
	

.4  3 fi 

Cool. comfortable shirts are awe. : 3 
lavOrite Choose from terries and 

in a wOe Varetv of "Me look,* styes 
Sizes S.M.L.XL 

• 

I 

011 	 *. 111 =7+1-  11 a X11 	 1110_/111 

I 
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Boys' Buckhide" 

Jeans 

4 8.8  
2 FOR 59 

BuckhiCe.  for boys super value 
They're made of 'Aged 100., 

denim that Plays hard and always 
looks good Sizes 1-7, reg 599 
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