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tors Fred Annen of A&H 
Parts and Supply, Al Jackson 
of Cobbs, Doug Lapins of 
Amstar and Dr. James Sims, 
a dentist. 

Outgoing president is Walt 
Hansen, owner of Dimmitt 
Super Market. Retiring direc-
tors are Bob Caddell, Bill 
Clark and Robert Ryan. 

The $6 per person admis-
sion price for the banquet in-
cludes a 10-ounce rib-eye 
steak served by K-Bob's 
Steakhouse of Dimmitt. 

Don Nelson will act as mas-
ter of ceremonies and dinner 
music will be provided by 
Janice Mooney Davis on the 
piano. 

-PD probe demanded 

Bill Brown 

Bank of Dimmitt; secretary- 
treasurer, Jack Edwards, 
Dimmitt attorney; and direc- 

Womack rites 
slated Friday 

'Citizen of the Year' 
to be named at banquet 

Dimmitt's Citizen of the 
Year will be named, the new 
officers and directors of the 
chamber board will be install-
ed and Bill Brown will be the 
featured speaker at the an-
nual Chamber of Commerce 
Banquet Saturday in the Cas-
tro County Expo Building, be-
ginning at 7:30 p.m. 

The Citizen of the Year 
award is presented each year 
to honor an outstanding Dim-
mitt citizen who is chosen by 
a secret committee guided by 
nominations sent in by Dim-
mitt residents. Last year's 
recipient of the award, Bill 
Behrends, will make the pre-
sentation this year. 

In between the more than 
1,000 appearances he has 
made, Brown is an insurance 
executive from Lubbock. Heis 
known for his combination of 
humor, magic and common 
sense philosophy. In 1976 he 
appeared on the network tel-
evision program "The Gong 
Show." 

Incoming officers and direc-
tors of the chamber board are 
president, Jerry Marvin, own-
er of KDHN Radio; vice-
president, Maxine Childers, 
trust officer of the First State 

Funeral rites 
for Rawlings 
held Tuesday 

ACTING CHIEF, AGAIN—Police Sgt. Santos 
Perez became Dimmitt's acting police chief 
again last Thursday morning following the 
resignation of Chief Joe Ben Mitchell. Here, 
Mayor Elmer Youts pins the chief's badge to 
Perez's shirt in a ceremony in city hall. Perez 

also served as acting chief after David 
Slaughter resigned the post in October. The 
two departed chiefs both alleged a lack of 
cooperation from the Castro County Sheriff's 
Office. 

-r"-A 	about 
dimmitt 
and 
castro 
county 
by b. m. n. 

Apparently, for the first 
time in memory, there has 
been enough friction develop 
between the various law en-
forcement agencies of the 
county to attract public at-
tention. A meeting of con- 

' 	cerned citizens was held last 
Friday as a result of the res-
ignation of the city chief of 
police. In- his letter of resig-
nation he said he was resign-
ing because of non-coopera-
tion from the Sheriff's de-
partment. Since this was the 
second time that a city police 
chief had resigned for that al-
leged reason, the public 
deemed some type of inquiry 
was needed. 

As a result of a KDHN 
radio editorial the city and 
county governing bodies ar-
ranged for a joint meeting of 
those two bodies, in a public 
meeting, to discuss possible 
solutions of the problem. 
Whether the course of action 
adopted at that meeting will 
solve the problem remains to 
be seen. Regardless of the 
charges or counter-charges 
that may be made before the 
committee by the two law en-
forcement agencies, the pub-
lic has the right to expect 
reasonably efficient law en-
forcement practices and 
shouldn't be satisfied with 
anything less. 

Farmers open doors 

to meet jointly and appoint a 
citizens' committee to inves-
tigate the law enforcement 
situation here. 

In his editorial, KDHN 
owner-manager Jerry Marvin 
said that "evidence indicates 
an existing problem with law 
enforcement in our commun-
ity and our county" which 
"affects the health and wel-
fare of all our citizens," and 
called for the city and county 
governing boards to meet 
jointly and create "an un-
biased citizens' committee 
• • . charged with investigat-
ing thoroughly the conduct of 
the Castro County Sheriff's 
Office and the Dimmitt Police 
Dept." 

In response to Marvin's ed-
itorial, County Judge Weldon 
Bradley and Mayor Elmer 
Youts called a public meeting 
for 4 p.m. Friday. The district 
courtroom—largest meeting 
room in the courthouse—was 
filled to capacity by the time 
the meeting got underway 
and more stood in the hall-
ways outside. 

In a letter to the city and 
county governing boards, B. 
M. and Don Nelson, co-pub-
lishers of the News, said the 
law enforcement situation "is 
affecting our people's trust in 
their law enforcement offi-
cials," and added that the 
conflict "could, if left un-
resolved, have an adverse 
effect on the safety of our 
people and the administration 
of civil and criminal justice in 
our county." 

The newspaper urged an 
estigation either by an ap-

inted citizens' committee or 
the current Grand Jury, 

concerned, such an investiga-
tion should be carried out by a 
citizens' group rather than by 
elected officials representing 
the two governments involv-
ed." 

The crowd voted heavily in 
]See SO-PD PROBE, Page 12) 

Seventy or more Castro 
County farmers and their 
wives are still trudging 
through the snow and pound-
ing on doors in Washington, 
D.C., this week in their effort 
to get 100% parity for their 
products. 

And with courtesy and per-
sistence, they're opening a lot 
of those doors, Bob DuLaney 
reported from Washington 

Public reaction to Dimmitt 
Police Chief Joe Ben Mit-
chell's resignation last week 
has led to an investigation 
into the relations between the 
police department and the 
county sheriff's office. 

A crowd of 200 or more 
Friday demanded that city 
and county commissioners 
and two local newsmen serve 
as a committee to investigate 
the conduct and procedures of 
the two law enforcement ag-
encies, and call in a private 
investigator if necessary. 

The fact-finding committee 
is to study complaints of non-
cooperation between the two 
agencies, which share dis-
patchers, radio equipment 
and jail facilities. 

Mitchell said in resigning 
last Wednesday, "I do not 
feel that I can properly rep-
resent the city and the men 
that I am responsible for 
under the conditions which 
now exist. It is now impos-
sible to coordinate any in-
vestigation or enforcement ef-
forts between the two agen-
cies operating in Dimmitt-
Castro County. Hopefully, at 
the end of the next three 
years this situation will 
change . . . ." 

Mitchell confirmed that he 
was referring to the remain-
der of Sheriff Granville Mar-
tin's four-year term. 

Mitchell was the second 
Dimmitt police chief to resign 
in recent months. His pre-
decessor, David Slaughter, 
also cited lack of cooperation 
from the sheriff's office as 
his reason for resigning last 
June 30. 

A former highway patrol-
man, court reporter and pri-
vete -inVestigator, fvfinell 
had been Dimmitt's police 
chief since Aug. 19. 

Mitchell's 	resignation 
prompted an editorial from 
KDHN Radio Friday, calling 
for the city commission and 
county commissioners' court 

Funeral services for Ethel 
Montgomery Womack, 86, 
will be held at 3 p.m. Friday 
in the First United Methodist 
Church of Dimmitt. 

Mrs. Womack, a resident of 
Castro County almost 60 
years, died Wednesday mor-
ning in Plains Memorial Hos-
pital. 

Born Aug. 22, 1892 at Alma 
(Ellis County), she moved 
with her family from Welling-
ton to Castro County in 
March, 1912. 

She married Lester Wo-
mack in Lubbock Dec. 23, 
1921. He died in March, 1932. 

Active in the Methodist 
Church since 1902, Mrs. Wo-
mack served as president of 
the WSCS, church pianist and 
as a member of many church 
committees through the 
years. She also was a past 
worthy matron of the Order of 
the Eastern Star and a charter 
member of the Dimmitt Gar-
den Club. 

She is survived by a son, 
John L. of Dimmitt; a daugh-
ter, Mrs. Harold Stephens of 
Dimmitt; a brother, W. C. 
Montgomery of Dimmitt; two 
sisters, Mrs. Jack R. Cowsert 
of Dimmitt and Mrs. Ray 
Koehler of Fort Collins, Colo.; 
three grandchildren and two 
great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services for Jimmy 
Rawlings of Dimmitt were 
held Tuesday at Dennis Fun-
eral Home Chapel of the 
Roses, with Rev. Marvin Ro-
ark, pastor of the First United 
Methodist Church of Dimmitt, 
officiating. Burial followed in 

• West Lawn Memorial Park 
under the direction of Dennis 
Funeral Home. 

Mr. Rawlings, 83, died 
Sunday. 

He was a native of Bran-
denburg, Ky., and had lived 
in Dimmitt for 41 years. A 
veteran of both World War I 
and World War H, he op-
erated a real estate and in-
surance business. He was a 
member of the Methodist 
Church, the VFW and the 
American Legion. 

Mr. Rawlings married Tina 
SoRelle in Clarendon in No-
vember of 1921. 

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Mrs. Carolyn 
Jones of Dimmitt and Mrs. 
Patricia Rodgers of Midland; 
six grandchildren; and one 
great-granddaughter. 

Pallbearers at the funeral 
were Carl Bruegel, Fred 
Bruegel Jr., Mike Bruegel, 
Dan Bruton, Garnett Holland 
and Bobby Jones, all of Dim-
mitt. 

Three firms 
burglarized 

FiaN Slow market forces 
Goodpasture shutdown 

ing various bills designed to 
ease the farm crisis ("None of 
them do much good, and 
we're sticking with the Am-
erican Agriculture bill, -  Du-
Laney said), attending meet-
ings large and small, and 
meeting privately with gov-
ernment officials. 

"Jo Beth Shackelford even 
ha quite a session Tuesday 
morning with (Agriculture)  
Secretary Bergland's wife," 
DuLaney reported. "Jo Beth 
sat in Bergland's chair in the 
USDA building, and she and 
Dick laid out a lot of facts for 
Mrs. Bergland." 

He added, "All the wives 
are helping a lot. You'd be 
surprised how many of the 
congressional aides are wo-
men. 

State Sen. Kent Hance ar-
rived in Washington Tuesday 
afternoon and set up a Wed- 

Three Castro County busi-
nesses were burglarized Fri-
day night apparently by the 
same burglar or burglars, ac-
cording to Castro County 
Sheriff Granville Martin. 

Dimmitt Welding and El-
ectric was the only one of the 
three that suffered any loss. 
Twenty dollars was taken, af-
ter entrance had been gained 
by forcing the door with a 
screwdriver. 

A screwdriver was also 
used to gain entry to Vardell 
Fuel and the office of Bruegel 
and Sons Elevators. Nothing 
was taken at either place. 

[Readings recorded at 7 
a.m. daily for the preceding 
24 hours.] 

Hi Lo Pr. 
Thursday 	 25 12 
Friday 	29 12 
Saturday 	29 13 
Sunday..... 45 15 
Monday 	 55 21 
Tuesday 	 58 22 
Wednesday 	 28 11 .04 
January Moisture 	 .11 
1978 Moisture 	 .11 

KDHN RADIO 

Museum group 

to meet Thursday are going to come back on 
production later, but we don't 
know yet just when that will 
be. We couldn't cut back to 
half-rate production econom-
ically; our only choices were 
to keep producing or stop. 
The situation right now—a 
high inventory, high produc-
tion costs and a poor market 
—doesn't make continued 
production feasible at this 
time." 

nesday meeting between the 
6,000 Texas delegates and 
Sen. Lloyd Bentsen. 

"We've already met with 
Bentsen once, but I think he 
needs some more coaching," 
DuLaney commented. "Sen. 
Tower is already co-sponsor-
ing the American Agriculture 
bill in the Senate. 

"Congressman Mahon is 
working himself to death for 
us," DuLaney said. " 	op- 
ened, many a door and has 
attended many of our meet-
irlgs himself." 

But despite the farmers' 
efforts, they're meeting re-
sistance. 

"We were received openly 
last week, probably because 
there were so many of us 
here,-  DuLaney said. "I think 
they thought we'd be gone 
Monday. But this week we're 
having a harder time getting 
in to see anyone." 

"We're getting a lot of run-
arounds," he added. "We 
hear a lot of 'We're all for 
you — it' s somebody else's 
fault.' We've been telling 
them we'll sure be glad when 
we find that 'somebody else.' 
We've found out that a lot of 
urban congressmen have been 
voting for us after all, that 
they go along with the Ag-
riculture Committee's recom-
mendations. We think we're 
narrowing down the field, and 
it looks more and more like 
the trouble is in the USDA." 

Tonight (Thursday) at 7 
p.m. the Castro County Mu-
seum Association will have its 
first membership meeting of 
the year. 

Association President B. M. 
Nelson reminds members of 
the cut back in the museum's 
opening hours, which are now 
from 1-5 p.m. on Mondays, 
Wednesdays and Fridays. 

uch 
how hard the Dimmitt people 
are working, -  DuLaney said. 
"They're going out before 
dawn, attending strategy 
meetings, going in groups of 
three to different offices, and 
they're getting a lot of doors 
open. 

"And the Hart people are 
going from here to there like a 
covey of quail," DuLaney 
said. "They're sticking to-
gether, they've got their 
banker and several of their 
businessmen with them to 
back them up, and they're 
making headway, too. 

"The Dimmitt group hasn't 
run into the Nazareth and 
Sunnyside delegations yet," 
DuLaney said. "There are 
somewhere between 45,000 
and 85,000 farmers here, de-
pending on whose estimate 
you want to believe. But I'm 
sure all our groups from Cas-
tro County are making them-
selves heard.- 

Delegates have been study- Aurelia Schoenenberger 
enters Precinct 4 race 13 earn JH All-Region Band berths 

and Rita Ramos were named 
alternates. 

According to Fred Allen, 
director of the junior high 
band, these students will per-
form in a concert at Monterey 
High School in Lubbock Sat-
urday. 

Thirteen members of the 
Dimmitt Junior High Band 
were awarded positions in the 
Junior High All-Region Band 
as a result of tryouts held at 
Littlefield Junior High Satur-
day. 

Tammy Stanford was given 

niga, contra-bass clarinet; 
Laurie Sides and Pam Nelson, 
alto saxophones; Jay Reeve 
and Jeff Moss. trombones; 
and Brad Murdock and Keith 
Gregory, snare drums. 

In addition, Larry Espinosa 

first chair honors on bass clar-
inet and Bryan Armstrong re-
ceived first chair on tuba. 

Others qualifying for the 
band were Katie Lapins, 
oboe; Monica Ginn, bassoon; 
DeNise Dobbs and Rhonda 
Nelson, clarinets; Winnie Zu- 

Mrs. Smith 

Jo Nita Smith 
enters race 
for treasurer 

A slow market has forced 
Goodpasture, Inc., to shut 
down the fertilizer production 
of its No. 2 plant here "for an 
indefinite period," according 
to Plant Manager Owen K. 
"Pete" Stewart. 

However, the 63 plant 
workers affected are remain-
ing on the job for mainte-
nance and construction pro-
jects, Stewart said. 

The No. 1 plant—which 
produces anhydrous ammo-
nia— is now on a standby 
basis and will be brought back 
into production "when eco-
nomic conditions warrant," 
Stewart said. 

Goodpasture already had 
shut down its No. 1 plant, 
which produces ammonia 
andlor 32-Nitrogen solution, 
and had placed it on a "turn-
around" status for overhaul 
and maintenance. The Good-
pasture complex here had 76 
employees before the No. 1 
plant was shut down late last 
year, but 13 became subject 
to layoff with that curtail-
ment. 

"Our shutdown isn't per-
manent," Stewart said. "We 

Promenaders 
prepare for room 
Feb. 4 dance 

Jo Nita Smith announced 
this week that she will be a 
candidate for county treasurer 
in the May 6 Democratic Pri-
mary election. 

Mrs. Smith has lived in 
Dimmitt 9' 2 years. 

"I think it would be a 
pleasure to serve the people 
of Castro County, and I know 
I can handle the job from a 
standpoint of honesty and 
capability," Mrs. Smith said. 

Raised at Rotan, she grad-
uated from Rotan High 
School. She has been employ-
ed by the Colonial Inn Res-
taurant for the past 8 1/2  years. 

"I would appreciate any 
help and influence anyone 
wishes to give on my behalf," 
Mrs. Smith said. 

Aurelia Schoenenberger an-
nounced this week that she 
will be a candidate for county 
commissioner from Precinct 4, 
subject to the May 6 Demo-
cratic Primary. 

"My campaign slogan will 
be 'Two for the Price of One,' 
because my husband is going 
to help with the roads," Mrs. 
Schoenenberger said. "We 
have seven miles of dirt road 
any direction we go, so we 
know about road problems. 
My husband is willing to work 
to get the roads in our pre-
cinct in shape." 

Born and raised at Naza-
reth, Mrs. Schoenenberger 
has long been active in the 
Democratic Party. She has 
served as precinct chairman 
of Voters' Precinct 13 since 
1972, and was a county dele-
gate to the State Democratic 
Convention in 1972. 

She and her husband, Al-
bert, farm 12 miles northeast 
of Nazareth. They have three 
children—Anita Wines, 23, of 
Stinnett, Albert Marvin, 22, 
of Vega, and Michael, 21, of 
Happy. 

"I have the time to devote 
to the job of county commis-
sioner, and an interest in 
county affairs. I'm going to 
work for the betterment of my 
precinct and of the county," 
Mrs. Schoenenberger said. 

She is president of the Ar-
ney Community Club, organ-
ist for the Holy Family Catho-
lic Church of Nazareth, a 
member of the Christian Mo- 

ALL-REGION JUNIOR HIGH BAND MEMBERS 
. . . Thirteen from Dimmitt Middle School 

Mrs. Schoenenberger 

thers Society, Women Involv-
ed in Farm Economics, and 
Women Who Want to Be 
Women. 

She was a delegate to the 
National Convention of Cath-
olic Women, and she and her 
husband attended the Pro-
Life/Pro-Family Rally in 
Houston in November. She 
was also a delegate to the 
state WIFE convention in Am-
arillo Jan. 14. 

Sunday she and her hus-
band went to Washington, 
D.C., for the "March for 
Life" program and lobbying 
effort against abortion. She 
also has worked voluntarily 
for the American Agriculture 
movement. 

The Dimmitt Promenaders 
will host a square dance Feb. 
4 to benefit the Castro County 
Heart Fund drive, which will 
kick off the first of February. 

No admission charges for 
the event will be asked, but 
donations will be accepted. A 
concession and door prizes 
will also be given by donation. 

In addition, baked goods 
will be auctioned during in-
termission. 

Representatives of the 
Promenaders will be seen 
Friday on Channel 4 at 12:20 
p.m. on "Let's Talk About 
It. ,,  
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Sheffy's Chatter  

Teacher from El Paso welcomed as new resident 
By MYRTLE SHEFFY several grandchildren. 

Lottie Bearden is home 
from Port Neches after her 
month's visit there with 
daughter Yvonne and family. 

radio station telling of their, 
meetings with the congress-
men and senators. We do 
hope the 50 farmers from here 
will get the job done—that is, 
better prices for the grain. * 

Malone. 
Awhile back the ladies went 

to Junction down in the Hill 
Country to visit Sue and Mac 
McCullum. I asked if they saw 
Dr. Blackburn, but they 
didn't get to see him. Seems 
they all read the News. 

Louie Allen received word 
that his sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Tom Allen, died last Thurs-
day. The Tom Allens live in 
Los Angeles. 

T. and Mae Webb of Lu-
ders, near Abilene, were here 
last week to visit son Carroll 
and Waldene Webb and the 
Townsends and new baby 
boy. You can see Carroll 
going places downtown in his 
wheelchair. You remember he 
was hurt last year when he 
jumped from a plane having 
trouble. The plane was on the 
ground, but Webb is doing 
fine and soon will be on his 
own. 

Dr. Dan Kent, at teacher at 
Wayland College, will lead 
the adults at First Baptist 
Church in a study of the Book 
of Exodus. You are invited to 
come Jan. 29 through Feb. 2. 
Ask the secretary for the time 
of day. Dr. Kent also is of-
ficiating at high school athlet-
ic events—a busy and in-
teresting man. 

Curtis and Marie Tate are 
home from another three-
week trip to Houston to be 
with daughter Pat and Ken 
Truelove and the grandson 
Brent home from the US 
service in North Carolina. 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

ed refreshments to Dorothy 
Elder, who won high score, 
Maxine Tidwell, who came in 
second, and Aural Davis won 
the guest prize. Others were 
Reba Touchstone, Jeanie Mil-
ler, Edna Riley and Betty 
Huckabay. 

Lowell and Judie Neumayer 
and a group of friends went to 
Sun Valley, Idaho last week-
end for skiing. 

and Lou Wethington and Ber-
nie's brother all went to Red 
River for a long weekend. 

Shelly Hickey of Amarillo 
visited her parents Bill and Jo 
Hickey Sunday and grand-
parents Claude and Neva. 

Jimmie Schulte received a 
call from her husband last 
week from Washington. A few 
farmers were visiting with a 
congressman and were all of-
fered the use of the phone to 
call home and let the family 
know that all are all right. He 
reported they have had very 
good reception from every-
one. But it will be a long, 
hard struggle. 

Bob DuLaney has called the 

OPTOMETRIST 

Visiting Edith Ramey re-
cently were Beatrice Willing-
ham, a niece, and Zetha 
Young, a friend, from Sudan, 
Martha and Marvin Kent 
from Lubbock visited two 
days, and Edwin Ramey and 
his wife from Lubbock and Jo 
Buchanan of Friona. 

The ski slopes had several 
people from here up in the 
mountains. These I heard 
were there—Lynn Schulte, 
her sister and husband Bernie 

300 West Bedford 

And this week they will be in 
Amarillo to stay with Tal 
while Jim and Judith Tate 
have a good trip to Hawaii. 
Nice to get away from this 
cold for a few days. 

* 

I was chatting with Aural 
Davis one day. She says that 
Dorit and Muriel Smiley have 
been here visiting friends. 
They live at Richardson. And 
Saturday Aural went to Ama-
rillo to see daughter Susie 
who, with husband Roy Ellis, 
is moving there from Dodge 
City. 

Nancy Hays of Hereford 
cooked a good lunch one day 
last week and asked Sue 
Merritt, Carole Dyer and Esta 
Vandiver to help eat it. This is 
a few of the group that used 
to play bridge together. 

The John Merritts went to 
Amarillo Friday to attend the 
FFA Stock Show. Sue saw 
these folks, but says the place 
was full of Dimmitt people—
the Fred Bruegels, the John 
Gilbreaths, the Ed Stanleys, 
the Buck Kenworthys, the 
Don Carpenters, the Luke 
McGuires (Lenna showed her 
livestock, came back and play-
ed basketball) and, oh, yes, 
the Jerry Clucks and Ted 
Sheffy. Probably Lanny Tuck-
er and the Robbs. Johnny 
Merritt showed his pig. 

Lint Merritt has bought and 
moved into his grandmother 
Pearl Sheffy's house, the red 
rock house on the corner of 
Lee and Seventh Street. Lint 
farms with his dad John. 

Anita Morris was hostess to 
her bridge playing group 
Thursday afternoon. She serv- 

Ph. 647-4464, Dimmitt, TX. 

Mrs. Cleo Connell has been 
in Anson for a few days with 
her mother Mrs. William 
Galt, who is recuperating 
from a recent heart attack. 

Carlee Warren was hostess 
at a coffee and bridge the cold 
Friday. Her guests were Mar-
tha Dannevik, Sandra Potts 
and Mary Jo Ray. Seems 
Mary Jo and husband Ed Ray 
moved here a few months ago 
from Illinois. Ed is with Am-
star. 

Rex and Dorothy Sheffy and 
boys went to Memphis to pick 
up the granddaughters, Don-
dra, Dedrea and Dee Andrea 
to keep while parents Tommy 
and Donna Stafford get mov-
ed to their new home in 
Muskogee. 

Jim and Ellen Hrabal will 
go to Temple in February to 
attend the 40th wedding an-
niversary for his folks Johnny 
and Nell Hrabal. Daughters 
Debbie and Julie will stay 
with sister Christi in Plain-
view. Christi is assistant man-
ager of TG&Y. 

Mrs. Lester McDermitt and 
niece and nephew Nub and 
Hazel Calhoun are home from 
a trip to Purdy, Mo., where 

they visited three brothers 
and attended the funeral of 
the younger brother Ephriam 
Hall. They visited Mrs. Mc-
Dermitt's sister Mrs. Dovie 
Coleman who is in St. John's 
Hospital in Springfield. You 
remember Mrs. Coleman 
stayed with Mrs. Kirkpatrick 
and Mrs. Ethel Womack. 

Helen Richardson, Evie 
Froehner, Ruth and Weldon 
Skinner % ent to Lubbock Sat-
urday night to hear the KLLL 
West Texas Opry. Zelda El-
lison was one of the partici-
pants in the musical program. 

Joe and Gladys Benson 
spent the weekend in Lubbock 
with daughter Susie and Gary 
Royal and the grandbaby girl. 

Juanita Blaine of Plainview 
and Koma Ratcliff went to the 
Sugar Beet Banquet in Here-
ford one night last week. Very 
good, too. 

Little Joel Elliott, son of 
Diane and Carter Townsend, 
has had much company lately, 
his grandmother Mrs. Otis 
Townsend here from Jackson, 
Miss., and the great grands, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. R. McKee 
from Granbury. Mrs. McKee 
is the mother of Mrs. Carroll 
Webb who is the grandmother 
here, and Mr. and Mrs. T. 
Webb. 

And the McKee's were 
here to visit Gary and Rhenea 
Webb. Gary is the son of the 
Carroll Webbs. 

Jimmy Rawlings, a long-
time resident of Dimmitt, died 
Sunday night after a long ill-
ness. He leaves his wife Tina, 
two daughters, Carolyn Jones 
and Patsy of Midland and 

Sue Coleman says tell you 
the John Smiths and the Joe 
Does and the Joneses stayed 
home this week. Too cold to 
get out. 

Anne Bolger is in Dimmitt 
from El Paso. She will teach 
Spanish to the bilingual teach-
ers of this area—Hereford, 
Tulia, Hart and here. Anne 
will teach two classes in the 
evening. Miss Bolger moved 
into my north bedroom Satur-
day. And the beautiful Anita 
Arellano who has lived in 
Dimmitt a couple of years is 
teaching the beginning class 
in Spanish. She is a third 
grade teacher at Richardson 
Elementary also. And Jo 
Thurston, teacher of the 
fourth, fifth and sixth grade in 
physical education, came by 
for coffee with the girls. Jo is 
also teaching an exercise class 
on Thursday nights at 8 for 
anyone interested in building 
their muscles. She is spon-
sored by the Home Demon-
stration Clubs. This will be at 
city hall. Jos guests Sunday 
were Rita and Clay Mimms of 
Lazbuddie. 

J. T. Swim of Littlefield vis-
ited B. M. and Viola Nelson 
Wednesday afternoon. The 
Swims are former Dimmitt 
reisdents. 

Elmo and Velma Hicks of 
Amarillo spent the weekend 
with her sister Alma and 
Glover Frazier. 

Leola Haberer is home from 
a Lubbock hospital and her 
daughter Betty Worrell from 
Rockwall is here to help out 
for a while. 

ATTENTION CATTLEMEN 
If you are out of pasture or not 

ready to sell your cattle at this time, 

why not let us grow them a while. 

Cheap grain and good care 

equals money in your pocket. 
v. 

KEMP FARMS 
Phone 647-5566 or 647-5201 

Dinmitt, Texas 

* 
IGLESIA DE CHRISTO 
E. Lee and S.E. Third 

Evangelista — Miguel Zuniga 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 10:00 a.m.  
Morning Worship. . . .11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all... 7:30 p.m. 

uALLimai 	 mdr114 

the Commu- 

LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ronnie Travis, Pastor 
Phone 647-2300 

Sunday— - 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship... 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00  p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00  p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services 	 8:00 p.m. 

d 
(Compiled from 
nity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth Am-. 
erican Legion Auxiliary.) 

REST 

Edwin-  Ramey, his friend J. 
B. Noland and Bub Ramey of 
Amarillo went to Fort Worth 
last week. They visited John-
ny Beane who is president of 
the Masonic Childrens Home. 
Mr. Beane is retiring from 
that job after many years. 
They all went to Arlington for 
a big fish dinner at the Billie 
Martin Cafe (expensive but 
good food) with Bub's sons 
Edgar and Edwin and fam-
ilies, then on to Lawton where 
Mr. Ramey says his 16 nieces 
and nephews rolled out the 
red carpet for them and had a 
big steak dinner. This was 
partly to celebrate Edwin's 
88th birthday Jan. 14. 

Millicent Davis and Sara 
Nofthen of Amarillo spent a 
few days in Lubbock visiting 
Millicent's brother Charles 
and Ruby Hastings, then on 
to Odessa to visit friend Fan-
nie Malone and her son Don 

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA MEXICANA 

300 N.E. 7th 
Pastor Van E. Hughes 
Secretaria Sara Salinas 

Tesorero Gabriel Montiel 
Domingo: 
Estudios Biblicos 	10:00 a.m. 
El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m. 
Miercoles: 
Instruccion Biblica.... 8:00 p.m. 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

JAN. 27 — James and 
Chunky Wilhelm. 

JAN. 29 — Cyril and Mitzie 
Brockman, Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Schulte. 

JAN. 30 — David and 
Rhonda Schaeffer. 

JAN. 31 — Al and Anna D. 
Gibbs, Dale and Delinda Mc-
Lain. 

FEB. 1 — Russ and Bar-
bara Reed. 

FEB. 2 — Ronnie and 
Becky Hooper. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 

Meeting in City Hall 
Community Room 

Donald Price, Pastor 
Phone 647-3403 

Sunday-- 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Children's Church.... 5:30 p.m. 
Evangelist Service.... 6:00 p.m. 

A day of play has tired 

this little one, but now 

sleep will bring about the 

needed rest. This is the time 

for restoring energies, and 

breaks the day's pace. 

The Lord set aside a day for rest 

and worship. This day allows 

us to be in the Lord's 

house and renews our energies 

for the week to come. 

Rodeo Association 
to meet Feb. 6 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
5th and Halsell 

Rev. Henry G. Perrin, Pastor 
Phone 647-2651 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 

Phone 647-3239 
For Starting Time 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Marvin Roark, Pastor 
Bill Anderson, Music & Educ. 

110 S.W. Third 
Phone 647-4106 or 647-4107 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m 
Morning Worship 	10:45 a.m 
MYF, Jr. Hi & Sr. Hi 	 5:30 p.m 
Evening Worship 	6.30  p.m 
Wednesday— 
General Meeting 
WSCS 	 910 a.m.  
Choir 	  7:30 p.m. 

Friday, Saturday 
& Sunday 

Activities of coming months 
in the Dimmitt Rodeo As-
sociation will be discussed at 
a meeting called for 8 p.m. 
Feb. 6 in Ann's Steak House. 
They include roping contests, 
a play day, local and area 
rodeo participation. 

All members and their fam-
ilies are invited to the meet-
ing and other interested per-
sons will be welcomed, a 
spokesman for the association 
said. 

9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship.. . .11:00 a.m. 
NYPS 	  6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m. 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Western Circle Drive 

Rev. Ed Manning, Minister 
Sunday— 
Church School 	10:00 a.m. 
Common Worship... 11:00 a.m. CARLILE 

gheatte 
Dimmitt, Texas 

• 

The Church is God's appointed agency in this world 
for spreading the knowledge of His love for man and 
of His demand for man to respond to that love by 
loving his neighbor. Without this grounding in the 
love of God, no government or society or way of life 
will long persevere and the freedoms which we hold 
so dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even from 
a selfish point of view, one should support the Church 
for the sake of the welfare of himself and his family. 
Beyond that, however, every person should uphold 
and participate in the Church because it tells the truth 
about man's life, death and destiny;  the truth which 
alone will set him free to live as a child of God. 

GULF coastline in the state 
of Texas stretches for 624 

	  miles. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 
Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Choir Rehearsal 	8.10 p.m. 

Quonsets: 
good places 

to put everything. 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 

Gary Cook, Pastor 
302 S.E. 2nd 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m.  
Morning Worship.. . 	11:00 a.m. 
Christ Ambassadors and 
Children's Church 	 6:00 p.m. 

Evangelistic Service 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

Coleman Adv. Serv .  

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 
Dale Wells, Minister 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship.. .10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 	7.30 p.m. 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
DEL PRIMOJENITO 

East Halsell St. 
Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Sermon 	  11:00 a.m. 
Lord's Supper and 

Feet Washing 	 11:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.30  p.m. 
Wednesday Services.. 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 
Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship and 

Lord's Supper 	 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Study 	 7.30  p.m. 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

412 North East Street 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Monday W.M.U.4'30 p.m. 
Tuesday Brotherhood. 7:55 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Sanctuary Choir.. 	.. Friday 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Raymond Jones, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO  p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 p.m. 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 
1001 W. Halsell — Ph. 647-4219 
Sunday— 
Mass in English 	 7:00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	 10:30 a.m.  
Religion Classes 	9.30 a.m. 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday— 
Mass 	  7:00 a.m. 
Holy Days— 
Mass in English.. ... 7:00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	8.00 p.m.  
Confessions— 
Friday 	7.00 to 8:00 p.m.  
Baptism by Appointment 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
[Northsidel 

Third and Halsell Streets 
Leonard Tittle, Minister 

Phone 647-5284 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship. ..10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m.  
Wednesday— 
Ladies Class 	 2:00 p.m. 
Mid-Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

Ranchway (P) 
Quonset Ranchway (P) and Ranchway (F) are two 
buildings with only one difference: flat or pitched 
roof. Otherwise, they're the tough little buildings 
which have built our reputation. Suitable for any 
farm use: livestock shelters, grain storage, ma-
chinery protection or you-name-it. And they'll cost 

you just about the price of a good pole barn. Come 
check out the basic Quonset at our place. We're 

your Authorized Quonset Dealer. 
With grain kit, approved for ASCS Loan. 

WESTERN AG SALES CO., INC. 
Broadway at BeIsher, Dimmitt 	647-3188 

MISSION PENTECOSTES 
404 N.E. 6th St. 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evangelistic.. 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service.. 8:00 p.m. 
Friday Bible Study.... 8:00 p.m. 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	710 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services... 7:30 p.m. 

Published Through the Cooperation of the Local Ministerial Association and Sponsored by the Undersigned Individuals and Business Institutions 

HAYS IMPLEMENT 

GOODPASTURE, INC. 
[Dimmitt Plant) 

FIRST STATE BANK 

CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 	HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 

DIMMITT TV CABLE 
DENNIS FLORAL & GIFTS 

Across From the Hospital 
647-3191 

DIMMITT '66' INC. QUONSET SEALE FLORIST 
Ph. 647-3554 

C&S EQUIPMENT CO. 
f 
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1 lb. 	2 lb. 	3 lb. 
$319 $635 $949 

DkWN 
Ak  Gets to Grease 
w 	TRY IT! 
111 SPECIAL PRICE 

VIENNA SAUSAGE 	 
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 
PARKAY MARGARINE  -- Tub  59' 
ATKINS KOSHER DILL PICKLES 	 

'WAGNER DRINKS  A-32"  3/$1 CHILI  '•° '°",°"P Con  79VOC—S—It 	 Ar 

M
ts 32 z o 	 SOS  SAVE ON NEXE PURCHASE 

BAR—B—QUE SAUCE 	59' CATSUP  Hun   77' 7:12.01 
• STRAWBERRY PRESERVES  "° '"z  79' 	$429  
• 

MIXED NUTS  mir; s:tt  99' 
01101101110110110110 •■•■•■•■•••• a• 

• 79 

89' 

$1 77 48 oz. Bottle CRISCO OIL 

0.0a011 Mei... 
T-BONE 

$ 

STEAK 
• SUPER 
II•  BUYS  MEM 	1 6 9 

! 	SAVORY  BACON 
TENDERIZED STEAK 

•El Pan 

$1 79  
Ready 

lb. 

• 
$o

. FROZEN 
100 FOODS 

•  
LITTLE COB CORN 

B8  r dc  so  eu  ynte 67c  
SPAGETTIOS  :7m:eznz  2/89' 
PORK & BEANS 	 '76`:,̀"'  4/$1  

$1  69  

• 
GIANT SIZE 

(202,9°LY) 

Fresh 	

$ lb. 	Chopped 	
1 39  lb. 

Wilson's 
1 lb. pkg. 

• 

•	  EBROWNIE MIXBe"“"ck ,,°' 99' 
SCUP—O—NOODLES  A"na'.  2/$1 
•  
• LIPTON INSTANT TEA 	 
111SWIFT PREM LUNCHEON LOAF 	12 oz 79 
• EKOUNTY KIST CORN  '2" 4/$1 
ONORTHERN TISSUE 	-Pk'  74' 
• 
• BRAWNY TOWELS 	Big Ro"  	2/$1 
•  
• 
•  
• 
•  
• 

PIE SHELLS 

Brilliant Peeled 99c  
and Devine) 

6 oz. 

SHRIMP 

RATH SAUSAGE 
1 lb. 77C 
pkg. 

FRIED CHICKEN 
Morton's 2 lb Box 

$1 88  

FISH STICKS 
Booth 16 oz. pkg. 

$1 19 

BOLOGNA 

Oscar Mayer 99, 
12 oz. pkg. 

3 oz. 

HONEY 
BUNS 
Morton's 39c  

9 oz. 

Texsun 

Swift 

KRAFT VELVEETA 

1 lb. t1 29 
Box 	1.  

5 

46 

OZ. 

OZ. 

ONON•1110  
3/$1 

Can  2/$1 

Folger
iv  
s nowNEitgiliagICE! 

Quart 69'0 
•  

SIRLOIN PATTIES 

FLOUR 	Gold Medal 25 lb. Bag 	
$299 

POP—UPS  Toast-Em 10 oz. 2/$1 

•  
• 

Betty Crocker 	• 
Layer Cake 

CAKE MIX III 

• DIMMITT • 
SUPER MARKET 

109 Belsher Street, Dimmitt 	Store Hours: 7 a.m. 'til 9 p.m. 	• 
e Give Double Gunn Bros. Stamps On Tuesdays And Wednesdays. 

SPECIALS GOOD JANUARY 26 THRU FEBRUARY 1, 1978 

MIRACLE 
WHIP 



Justice Real Estate 
115 West Bedford 

647.4101 	 Night 647.5512 

Home Listings 
All our new homes include range, dishwasher, disposal, central heat 
and air, and 6-ft. Western Red Cedar fence. 

160.2 Ruskin Circle - three-bedroom, two-baths, fireplace, two-car 
garage, approximately 1350 sq. ft. 

615 W. Andrews - three-bedroom, one bath, one car garage, 
appliances, fenced yard. Priced Mid-20's. 

1012 Oak - Large three bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car garage, fireplace. 
Many, many extras. 

403 SW Sixth St. - Two-bedroom, one-bath home, freshly painted 
outside. 

Farm Listings 

HALF SECTION - One mile north of Dimmitt. Three wells. 29% 
down, 20-year payout. 

500 ACRES - Four miles northeast of Dimmitt Eight wells with 11/2  
miles of underground tile. Only 15% down, with 20 years to pay off. 

160 ACRES-southwest of Easter. Good six-inch well. 

160 ACRES-Northeast Castro County. Dryland with four-inch 
domestic well. 

340 ACRES-Near Amey. Dryland. 

• 
3-bedroom home with 
fence, fireplace, base-
ment, about 3 years old, 
southwest part of Dim-
mitt. Owner leaving 
town, needs to sell. Like 
new. COME & LOOK! 

COMMERCIAL PROP-
ERTY on Hwy. 385. 
Good locations. 1 loca-
tion in wet precinct. 

Good 160 Acre irrigated 
farm, north of Hart, TX. 

CRAIG 
REAL ESTATE 

112 E. Jones 	Dimmitt 
Call 647-4223 

Nights 647-3271 
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SELL may 
e Rimy 
***************** •• • •.111•••• 	 •••• •••*••••••••••••••••••• 

5-FARM EQUIPMENT 
•••••••••••••••••••••• 
P.V.C. PLASTIC PIPE, center 
pivots, steel buildings, grain 
storage bins, augers. Western 
Ag Sales Co. 647-3188. Dim- 
mitt. 	 5-15-tfc 

8-SERVICES 1-REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND The Castro County News 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

2-FOR RENT 
0 11 40 40 40 41 41 41 • 41 40 41 40 41 41 41 41 41 41•41 1 ii••••••••••••••••14.14•9 

►14_-_CARD_PF THANKS 
1••.••••,.••••••••••fp 

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to express our sin-

cere thanks for the cards, flow-
ers, visits and phone calls while 
we were in the hospital, also 
for the food. Thanks also to Dr. 
Lee and the nurses and Brother 
Roark for the prayers and 
visits. 

647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 
Published each Thursday in Dimmitt, Texas, by the News Pub-

lishing Co., 108 W. Bedford, Second Class Postage Paid at Dimmitt, 
Texas. Publication Number 092980 

The Choice House Buys 
of Dimmitt are Listed 
with Us. We Have 
Houses Priced to Fit 
Almost any Family Bud-
get. Call Today!! 

a•O••••••0••0••••••.•• 1  

CARPENTRY, remodeling, re-
pairs, sheetrocking, taping, 
panelling, painting, mobile 
home leveling, skirting, an-
choring. Work reasonable. 
Sandy Parsons, 647-4553. 

8-15-tfc 

Al••••••••••••••••••••4  

TRAILER SPACES for rent. 
Phone 647-2478. 	2-22-tfc 

TRAILER SPACE for rent. Call 
Brenda Andrews, 647-2650 or 
647-5463. 	 2-18-tfc 

•••••••••••••••••••••• 
PUBLISHER'S NOTICE: 

All real estate advertised in 
this newspaper is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference, 
limitation, or discrimination 
based on race, color, religion, 
sex, or national origin, or an 
intention tc make any such pre-
ference, limitation, or discrim-
ination." 
This newspaper will not know-
ingly accept any advertising for 
real estate which is in violation 
of the law. Our readers are 
informed that dwellings adver-
tising in this newspaper are 
available on an equal oppor- 
tunity basis. 	1-28-tfc 

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press Assoc-
iation, Panhandle Press Association and National Newspaper Assoc.  

NEW LISTING 

Redecorated throughout 
-Lovely 	3-bedroom 
brick home, 11/2  baths, 
sunken den with fire-
place, fence, new cen-
tral heating unit. Over 
1500 sq. ft. Priced at 
$32,500. 

One Year, $7.00 

FOR RENT: Trailer spaces on 
pavement, hard surfaced park-
ing area. Ph. 647-2177. 

2-26-tfc 

WE REPAIR all makes of fence 
chargers. Dimmitt Consumers 
Electric Shop, NE 3rd & Etter. 

5-16-tfc 
(•••••••••••••••,•••••• 

b•• 6-AUTOMOTIVE 
j •• • •••••••••••••••• 
FOR SALE: 1974 Opel Manta 2 
dr. automatic. AM-FM stereo 
radio, 28,000 miles, good tires 
Call 938-2462 or see at Meth-
odist Parsonage in Hart. 

6-17-2tc 

MAE AND CLINT COX 
14-17-1tp 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
School Year, $5.50 	Six Months, $4.50 

I WOULD like to do Babysitting 
in my home for working moth- 
ers, Monday - Friday. Please 
call 647-3640. 	8-15-tfc BUSINESS LOCATIONS FOR 

LEASE, 2 buildings, 25X40, 
good condition. Ph. 647-3194. 

2-43-tfc 

D• ••••• OOOOO •••••••O• DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	 Tuesday Noon 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 	Monday, 10 A.M. 
Sports, Society, Church News 	  Monday Noon 
Community Correspondence 	 Monday Noon 
Personal Items 	  Monday, 5 P.M. 
General News, City and County 	 Tuesday Noon 

15-LEGAL NOTICES WANT TO DO custom work: 
listing, discing and chiseling. 
938-2544. 	 8-43-tfc 

HOUSE INSULATION. Call 
Air-Tite Insulation Co. or see 
Robert Daniel, 647-2372. 

8-16-tfc 

FOR RENT: 2-bedroom house, 
carpeted. Call 647-2375. 

2-16-tfc 

••••411•••••••••••••••41 

NOTICE 
The City of Dimmitt offers 

for sale the following: 
(1) One 1973 Ford 4-door 

Sedan, Serial No. 3G53S258- 
545, complete with V-8 En-
gine. 

(2) One 1973 Ford 4-door 
Sedan, Serial No. 3G53S258- 
546, complete with V-8 En-
gine. 

All offers shall be made by 
sealed bid, delivered to Chief 
of Police of the City of Dim-
mitt at City Hall, Dimmitt, 
Texas, on or before 6:30 P.M. 
Feb. 20, 1978. Vehicles may 
be inspected at City Hall 
during office hours. Automo-
biles above described are in 
poor condition. 

-s- GARNETT HOLLAND 
City Clerk 

City of Dimmitt 
Dimmitt, Texas 

15-11-4tc 

••••••••••••••••••••• 

The warmth of a fire-
place - 3 bedroom 
brick, 1 3/4  baths, central 
heat & air, carpet, 
fence, 2-car garage. 
South part of town. 
Priced to sell at $35,000. 

Elaine Schulte 
on honor roll 

TEXAS ENERGY has received 
another carload of barreled 
anti-freeze selling at $2.50 per 
gallon or $2.70 per gallon by 
the case, long as it lasts. Call 
647-2135. 	 6-10-tfc 

OFFICE SPACE available for 
lease. Will renovate to suit 
tenant. Ye Olde Inn. 121 E. 
Bedford. 	 2-16-tfc 

TRAILER SPACE for rent, east 
of city, large lot. Call 647-3659. 

2-15-tfc 

CARPET CLEANING - Also 
windows washed, floors refin-
ished. Prices competitive, un-
conditional guarantee. Dimmitt 
Janitorial Service, Warren 
Finch. 647-4558. 	8-24-tfc 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

•••••••••••••.-:•••••• 
The News has been authoriz-

ed to announce the candidacies 
of the following persons for the 
offices indicated, subject to the 
action of the May 6 Democratic 
Primary Election: 

GLASS 

TWO BEDROOM house for 
sale by owner. For appointment 
call 647-5227. 	1-4-tfc 

14x72 TRAILER and lot, 1972 
Kingswood, 2 bedroom, car-
port, 6-foot fence. Call 647- 
2273 or 647-2573. 	1-46-tfc 

THREE BEDROOM HOUSE 
for sale; one and three-fourths 
baths, fenced corner lot, 
sprinkler system, lots of extras. 
Call 647-4343. Go by at 1012 
Oak Street. 	 1-50-tfc 

FOR SALE: Frame two-story 
house in Nazareth. Call 806-
293-5785 after 3 p.m. 1-16-3tc 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house, 
401 NW 4th, Call 227-2087 
collect or 647-3242 after 5. 

1-11-tfc 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 1825 
sq. ft. brick home, 3 bedroom, 
2 bath, fireplace, newly re-
modeled. 705 Maple. 647-3674. 

1-44-tfc 

••••••••• • •••••••••••• FARM DIRT WORK: Tailwater 
pits dug and cleaned, land 
leveling. Dump truck and front 
end loader work. Elevating 
scraper work. Mumme Exca-
vating. Call 945-2255 nights or 
early a.m. 	 8-15-tfc 

Ideal location, lovely 
brick home - 3 bed-
rooms, 2 baths, all car-
pet, fence, 2 car garage, 
lots of trees. Only 
$36,250.00 

Elaine Schulte, the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert 
Schulte of Nazareth, has been 
listed on the Dean's Honor 
Roll at Wayland Baptist Col-
lege for the fall semester. 

The sophomore physical ed-
ucation major and biology 
minor is a member of the 
Flying Queens and is a 1976 
graduate of Nazareth High 
School. 

FOR 
COUNTY COMMISSIONER: 

Precinct 4: 
ALFONS (AL) MAURER 

1• 
3-FOR SALE, MISC. 
•• •••••••••••• • ••••• 

FOR SALE: Baldwin organ. 
Full instrument keyboard. Call 
647-4450. 	 3-7-tfc 

Large stock of flat glass for 
combine and tractor cabs, etc. 
Wholesale and retail on L-O-F, 
Pittsburgh and Carlite wind-
shield glass. Installed right and 
weather-tight. See Gene at 
Dimmitt Upholstery & Garage, 
214 N. Broadway, 647-2534. 

6-52-tfc 
JERRY WILHELM 
(Incumbent) 

ARE ROACHES and termites 
your unwanted guests? Call 
Plains Pest Control, Amarillo, 
PCL456PTL, 355-4341. 8-11-tfc 

CH4NTEL'S GROOMING SA-
LON, 210 W. 5th, 364-2048. 
Hereford. 	 8-35-tfc 

AURELIA SCHOENENBER-
- GER 

Pancake supper 

slated at Easter ••••••••••••••••••••4 

SALE NEEDLEPOINT, crewel, 
cross stitch quilt tops and table 
cloths. Christmas kits. Dan's of 
Canyon. 	 3-16-3tc 

FOR SALE: two-story building 
to be moved or torn down. 
647-2375. 	 3-9-tfc, 

FOR SALE: 1973 16-foot camp 
trailer, call 647-4378. 	3-15-tfc 15-7LEGAL NOTICES  A ••.••••.••••••••••••., 

FOR COUNTY JUDGE: 
WELDON BRADLEY 

(Incumbent) 

* Room Galore - Low 
* Price - Must see this 
* house with 1800 sq. ft. 
* living area. Large lot, 
* good location. 4 bed-
* rooms, 2 baths, New 
* roof and steel siding 

plus extras. A real buy 
* at $28,000.00 

Nice frame home, with 
* over 1700 sq. ft. living 

area, 3-bedroom, 2 
* baths, living room, den, 

plenty 	of 	storage, 
* $26,500. 

* 3-bedroom home, in fine 
loca 	in sout p 	f 

* to 	 r et 
baths, 	2c , cute. 

* Ow 	says sell today! 

* 3 New homes - Build-
ers say sell now!!!! 

* Call Today to see this 2 
* bedroom with beautiful * 

new carpet in all rooms. 
* Attached garage with * 

4C carport. Great buy at 
* $18,000. 

Good neighborhood - 3 
* bedroom, 13/4  bath, 2 * 

car garage, brick, only 2 I(  
* years old. $36,000. 

* Lovely brick 3-bedroom, 
* 13/4  bath, fireplace, * 
it  glass enclosed patio, 
* plus much much more. * 

Prime location. 

* Commercial building - 
well located with offices, 

* storage building, locat- 
ed on 1/2  block. 

FARMS 
CASTRO COUNTY 

* West of Dimmitt, 480 * 
* acres, 3 irrigation wells, lc 

3-bedroom home, lots of * 
* underground pipe. Pos- 

session can be ar-
* ranged. 

•••••••••••••••••••••1 

CAMPER SHELL for sale. All 
fiberglass, for long bed. 647- 
2466 after 1 p.m. 	3-15-tfc 

HOMEMADE GIFTS for all 
occasions-bridal showers, ba-
by showers. Quilts and baby 
quilts. Senior Citizens Center, 
SE Third and Lee. 647-2654. 

3-39-tfc 

THE PLACE to find the right 
flowers, hanging baskets and 
gifts. Dennis Floral & Gifts, 
409 NW 4th, Ph. 647-3197. 

3-44:tfc 

FOR COUNTY-DISTRICT 
CLERK: 

ZONELL MAPLES 
(Incumbent) 

The Easter Lions Club will 
hold a pancake supper Sat-
urday, Feb. 4, to benefit the 
Texas Lions Crippled Child-
ren's Camp. 

Serving hours will be from 
6 to 8 p.m. in the Easter 
Community Building. Tickets 
at $1.50 each are being sold 
by club members and will also 
be available at the door. 

PORTABLE WELDING. Com-
plete on the site. Danny Gools- 
by. 647-5401. 	8-45-tfc 

SEE YOUR independent in-
surance agent for complete in-
surance service. Ivey Agency, 
210 W. Bedford, 647-3518. 

8-6-tfc 

FOR SALE: 1972 Suzuki GT-
750, driving lights, road pegs, 
sissy bar, fairing, good con-
dition, $950. 647-5680. 6-16-2tc 

FOR SALE: '76 Pinto, good 
condition, low mileage. Call 
647-3195 and ask for Sandy. 

6-15-tfc 
STATEMENT OF INTENT 

TO CHANGE RATES 
In accordance with Article 

Section 43 of the Public 
Utility Regulatory Act and 
Section 4, Rule 052.01.00.043, 
paragraph (a), (2), (A) of the 
Rules of Practice and Pro-
cedure of the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, Conti-
nental Telephone Company of 
Texas hereby notices its in-
tent to change rates effective 
February 3, 1978. 

These rate changes are de-
signed to increase Continen-
tal's gross intrastate revenues 
by approximately 7.1% per 
year. 

A complete copy of the new 
rate schedule is on file with 
the Public Utility Commission 
at Austin, Texas. The new 
rate schedule is also available 
for public inspection in each 
of Continental's business of-
fice locations in Texas. 
CONTINENTAL TELEPHONE 

COMPANY OF TEXAS 
15-15-4tc 

FOR SALE: Mobile home, 14 x 
80. 647-2478. 	1-7-tfc 

7- BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES 

•••••••••••••••••••••• 

HAVE A highly profitable & 
beautiful Jean Shop of your 
own. Featuring the latest in 
Jeans, Denims & Sportswear, 
$13,500 includes beginning in-
ventory, fixtures & training 
Call anytime for Mr. Waters at 
4.501) 568-5125. 	7-17-1tp 

BUILD YOUR own business 
vlstth fast growing company. 
Highly effective products. Full 
or part time direct sales. Phone 
806-647-5517. 	7-10-tfc 

FOR COUNTY TREASURER: 
FLORENE LEINEN 
(Incumbent) 

PAULINE (POLLY) MAN-
NING 

ON THE FARM tractor and 
combine air conditioner repair 
and service. JIM'S FARM A/C 
SERVICE, call 647-5310 or 
647-3127. 	 8-20-tfc 

••••••••••••••••••••• 

FOR SALE by Owner: 3 bed- 
rooms, 13/4  baths, fenced cor- 
ner lot, fruit and shade trees. 
701 Oak. 647-3621. 	1-15-tfc 

15-LEGAL NOTICES JO NITA SMITH 
1••••••••••••••••••••• FOR SALE: 2 bedroom brick 

house, near school, 700 W. 
Bedford. Owner left.town, must 
sell. Call 806-447-5858 or 2996. 

1-15-4tc 

•••••••••••••••••••••• 

9-HELP WANTED FOR JUSTICE OF THE 
PEACE, PRECINCT 2: 

MARSHALL YOUNG 
(Incumbent) 

,*••••••••••••••••••••( 
HELP WANTED: Bus drivers, 
both men and women. $200 per 
month minimum. Contact John-
ny Mason at 647-3101 or Morris 
Gowdy at 647-4607. 	9-52-tfc 

•••••••••••••••••••••• FOR COUNTY COMMISSION- 
ER PRECINCT 2: 

EDD WILSON 
(Incumbent) 

8-SERVICES 

FOR SALE: farm house to be 
moved or torn down. Box 63, 
Levelland, TX 79336. 	1-16-tfc 

FOR SALE: 3-bedroom, 1 bath 
home, completely carpeted, 
well cared for, with single car 
garage and storage room, in 
Nazareth. Call 806-293-5785 af- 
ter 3 p.m. 	 1-16-3tc 

•••••••••••••••••411••11411 

LEGAL NOTICE 
CHARLIE JONES dba 

JONES SPRAYING SERVICE, 
a sole proprietorship doing 
business in Castro and Lamb 
Counties, Texas, hereby gives 
notice in accordance with Ar-
ticle 1302-2.02, V.A.T.S., of 
his intention to incorporate 
under the name of JONES 
SPRAYING SERVICE, INC., 
and to continue operation of 
such business under the cor-
porate name. 

THERMOPHORE (the auto- 
matic moist heat pack) by 
Battle Creek now available at 
Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tfc 

REAL GOOD deepfreeze, 410 
shotgun, riding lawn mower. 
Phone 647-3284. 	3-16-tfc 

FASHION TWO TWENTY 
COSMETICS, Lorena Cates, 
407 NW 3rd. 647-4210. 

3-41-30tp 

LVN WANTED at South Hills 
Manor Nursing Home. Contact 
Joyce Adrian, director of nur- 
ses. 647-3117. 	9-49-tfc 

PART TIME: Unusual oppor-
tunities for Sales Representa-
tive in this area representing 
Hydrotex, a nationally known 
oil company. Position available 
for Part-Time Sales Representa-
tive. High income and oppor-
tunity for advancement. Know-
ledge of farm and industrial 
machinery helpful. Special 
training if hired. For personal 
interview mail qualifications, 
name, address, phone number 
to Bill Pearce, Dept. WD969C, 
Box 47843, Dallas, Texas 
75247. 	 9-17-1tp 

COUNTY-DISTRICT ATTOR- 
NEY 
KEITH LEMONS 

DEAD STOCK removal, 7-day 
week service. Please call soon 
as possible. Hereford Bi-Pro-
ducts. Phone 364-0951. 

8-27-tfc 
(Political Advertisements 

Paid For by the Candidates) 
15-15-4tc 

TRI-CHEM PAINTS. 647-2572. 
3-31-tfc 

141•••••••••••••••••••• DO YOU NEED your windows 
washed, carpets steam-cleaned 
or floors waxed? Business and 
residential. Call ABC Janitor- 
ial. 289-5597. 	8-3-tfc 

4- HOUSEHOLD GOODS 
BY OWNER 

1606 Sunset Circle 
Drive. 3 bedrooms, 2 
full baths with doub-
le sink vanities, 
kitchen with long bar 
and dining area, lots 
of cupboards. 

647-3521. 

DEPENDABLE LADIES want 
to do paper hanging. Refer-
ences. Reasonable rates. Large 
or small jobs. Call Jimmie 
Middleton 258-7715 or Jean 
Collier 258-7396 at Hereford. 

8-1-tfc 

•••••••••••••••••••••• 
FOR SALE: Three good used 
color television sets. Ph. 647-
5313, 613 W. Andrews. 

4-12-tfc 
FOR SALE: Used Kenmore 
automatic washing machine, 
needs belt. Make offer. 8-foot 
steel garage door, 2 single 
trees. To give away, cook stove 
for parts and gas refrigerator 
that works. Call 647-4619 after 
5 o'clock p.m. 	4-17-2tc 

FOR SALE: Zenith stereo, AM-
FM recorder, good condition. 
647-3686. 	 4-17-2tc 
11•• •• • ••• ••• •••••••••• 

5-FARM EQUIPMENT 
•5••••••0••••••••••0•5 
FOR SALE: Miller Offset 
Discs. For free demonstration 
contact Farmer's Supply Co. 
647-3350. 	 5-41-tfc 

FOR SALE: 1962 M-5 Moline 
Tractor. Good shape, reason- 
able. Ph. 647-2526. 	5-29-tfc 

6-INCH PUMP, excellent 
shape, 200 foot setting. Trade 
for 4-inch pump. Bail Hill, 995- 
4346. 	 5-17-2tc 

• 0•5•••••••••••••05••11 LET US make you an estimate 
on Targonal bath and kitchen 
floors and walls. TROY KIRBY, 
647-5351. 	 8-37-tfc 

13-LOST & FOUND WILSON 
REAL ESTATE 

•••••••••••••••••••••. 
LOST: Small female puppy, 
light tan or blond with blue 
eyes. Reward offered. 647- 
4595. 	 13-17-2tp Southeast of Square 

in Dimmitt 11•••••••••••••••••••••• 

REPAIR OF ALL brands of 
major appliances. Dimmitt Ap- 
pliance Center, Jim Hrabal. 
647-5690. 	 8-7-tfc 

14-CARD OF THANKS, Several homes in very de-
sirable locations. These 
homes are appraised and 
can be financed with 

buyers. 

ATCHLEY'S PET GROOMING. 
Grooming, cleanup and bath-
ing. Call for appointment. 
Susie Atchley. 647-2225. 8-3-tfc 

* IF YOU HAVE ANY 
* INTEREST IN BUYING 
* LAND in Castro, Par- 

mer, Lamb, Hale, or 
Curry Counties, SEE 

ir US. We have it listed. RENTAL color TVs. Kittrell 
Electronics. 	 8-51-tfc 

Apnroximately 128 Acres 
in Sonnyside area, best 

. 1-8" well. Some 
highway frontage. 

GEORGE 
REAL ESTATE 

•••••••••••••••••••••4 

We would like to express our 
'sincere thanks for the love and 
concern shown to us during the 
passing of our loved one, David 
Partner. Your prayer, cards, 
calls, food and flowers were 
deeply appreciated. 

SALLY PARMER 
JOE & DAVEINE WALL 

& FAMILY 
CAROLYN EATON 

T. C. & FRANCES PARMER 
& FAMILY 

RAY & ESTHER PARMER 
& FAMILY 

14-17-1tc 

WOOD AND CHAIN LINK 
FENCES, invest a little more in 
QUALITY, eliminate EXPEN-
SIVE repairs, financing avail-
able, estimates with no obliga-
tion. Contact Gene Sanders, 
647-2477. 	 8-30-tfc 

Hwy. 385 South 
Jimmie R. George, 	* 

Broker 
Office 647-4174 

Gwen Bryant, 647-5509 4:4  
Danny Rice, 647-3552 * 
Dub George, 647-4469 

One-quarter section, three 
bedroom home, large barn, 
steel and concrete floor, 1 
well. Would consider sell-
ing to a qualified FHA 
buyer. 

***************** 

CARD OF THANKS 
Many thanks to all those 

concerned in helping search for 
my 21-month-old son, Phil. A 
special thanks to the couple, 
whoever you are, who found 
him and took him to the city 
police department that night. 
When we needed them most, 
the sheriff's deputies and po-
lice department, Highway Pa-
trol and even the county judge 
and neighbors deserve credit 
for the help and support they 
gave me and my family in 
searching for my son. 

Gratefully, 
JOAN THRASHER 

14-17-11c 

Several good irrigated 
farms in Castro, Parmer 
and Lamb Counties. 

TREE SPRAYING, custom tree 
and landscape service. T. J 
Carter, Tex. lic. PCL-1440Pt-
LOW. Amarillo 373-4593, Dim-
mitt representative Randy Gilli- 
land, 647-2448. 	8-23-tfc FOR SALE: 2 story house to be 

moved. Excellent condition. 
764-3470. 	 1-17-2tc 

Irrigation Pipe 
Concrete or Plastic 

Underground 

Pipe Repair 
BACKHOE WORK 

945-2535 Day 
Nazareth, Texas 79063 

FOR SALE: 100' x 150' choice 
lot on Lake Mackenzie. Call 
647-5313. 	 1-17-tfc 

We have several inquiries 
on cash lease and farm 
rentals for 1978. Would 
like to handle these for 
you. 

FOR SALE: 3-bedroom, 2-bath, 
brick home. fenced yard, doub-
le garage, carpeted, central 
heat and air. Ph. 647-2266 or 
647-4159. 	 1-17-tfc 

THREE BEDROOM, 2 bath, 
central heat and air, 2-car ga-
rage. 701 W. Halsell. Call 
647-3287. 	 1-17-tfc 

Edd Wilson, Broker 
Phone 
Office: 647-4487 
Nights: 647-4345 



FOR INSURANCE CALL 

Kent Birdwell, Agent 
116 E. Jones St. 
Phone 647-3427 

Hesston Beet Harvesting 
Equipment 
Direct Type Models 496/496W & 6 
Tank Type Model 565 

"We stand behind 
our work. That's 

Reason No. 5 why 
you should let us 
do your taxes." 

Henry W Block 

If we prepare your return and 
the IRS should call you in for 
an audit, Block will go•with 
you at r extra charge. Not 
as your legal representative, 
but to answer any questions 
about how your taxes were 
prepared 

H&R BLOCK 
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

116 W. Bedford 
Dimmitt, TX. 

E.B. & Dave Noble 

The first game of the Hart 
eighth grade boys and girls 
basketball tournament is set 
for 4 p.m. today (Thursday) in 
the high school gym. 

In the girls' division, Hart 
8th will play Dimmitt 8th B in 
the first game of the tourney. 
Then, the Hart 7th will play 

I ((hi/WWII 
L 	 

We WM Be Closed Thursday 
Morning & WiN Open At 
12:00 Noon To Begin Sale 

4 

New officers of the county 
ASCS include John Gilbreath, 
vice-chairman of the county 
committee and Charles Axtell, 
Ray Joe Riley and Milburn 
Haydon, members of com-
munity committees. 

A trace of snow was re-
ceived Wednesday and a trace 
again on Friday. There was no 
moisture to speak of it with it. 

Baptist Men's Day was ob- 
served in the church Sunday. 
Jake Deal of Muleshoe 
brought the Sunday morning 
message. David Sadler, Lynn 
Brown and Thomas Parson 
gave their testimony during 
the evening services. Gale 
Sadler brought the message. 
Roy Phelan had charge of the 
service. Mrs. Deal attended 
the morning services with her 
husband. 

Rev. Raymond Jones, Mil-
burn Haydon and Hershel 
Wilson attended the Llanos 
Altos Associational Workers' 
Conference at Trinity Church, 
Muleshoe, Monday night. 

• 
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Carr of 

Springlake left last Sunday for 
her check-up in Houston on 
Thursday morning. They 
spent Sunday and Monday 
nights with her sister at 
Mount Vernon and went on to 
Lufkin where they spent Tues-
day with his sister, leaving for 
Houston Wednesday morn-
ing. They were in a lot of rain 
and snow, but made the trip 
without trouble, getting home 
Friday night. She got a good 
report and they removed the 
tooth that has been bothering 
her. 

Vicente Lopez was admitted 
to St. Mary's Hospital in Lub-
bock Monday and underwent 
surgery on his windpipe Tues-
day for removal of a tumor. 
He was dismissed Wednesday 
evening and is scheduled for 
surgery again in six weeks. 

Mrs. Gerald Graham was 
dismissed from Plains Mem-
orial Hospital in Dimmitt after 
undergoing an emergency ap-
pendectomy last Saturday 
night. 

Rev. and Mrs. Murle Rog-
ers of Ropesville visited Sat-
urday afternoon with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. Paul Waggoner and 
Mrs. L. B. Bowden. • 

Rev. Raymond Jones visit-
ed in the hospital in Lubbock 
several times this week with a 
friend, Mrs. Verna Bell Stal-
cup of Cotton Center. She 
passed away Saturday night 
and he officiated at her fun-
eral in Cotton Center Monday 
afternoon. 

Mrs. Raymond Jones visit-
ed with her mother Mrs. Mae 
Etta Watts of Fort Worth all 
this week since she took the 
flu while there. 

• 

Mrs. Embree Roy Sadler 
worked with auxiliary duties 
at Plains Memorial Hospital 
in Dimmitt Monday after-
noon. 

Mrs. David Sadler, Mrs. 
Larry Sadler, Mrs. Ezell Sad-
ler and Mrs. James Powell 
and Mrs. Tex Conard of Dim-
mitt attended the bridal show-
er of Mrs. Tim Dawson, sister 
of Mrs. David Sadler, in 
Hereford Friday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Gil-
breath, Coby, Matt and Hal 
attended the Amarillo Stock 
Show Friday. The boys also 
attended Thursday. Coby and 
Matt showed barrows. 

Jackie and Jerri Ka Clark 
attended the Amarillo Stock 
Show Thursday and Friday. 
Jerri Ka placed on her lambs 
and won seventh on her steer. 

Kevin and Jodie Riley 
showed lambs in the Lamb 
County Livestock Show this  

Mens 
BuckhWe 

JEANS 

$788  
11110% 
• % vi•. 	• 

9 fast-growing varieties to choose from: 

MONEY 

$1, $2, $5, $10, $20, $50, $100, $500, $1000. Plant 
as many as you like at The Money Growers 
Association. Sprinkle in a few more on a reg-
ular basis and we'll add daily, compounded 
interest. In a short time they'll grow high and 
healthy so you can reap the profits. And this 

Rs is the perfect time of the year to start' 

ASSOCIMON 	'a 	"We look to your future with interest." 

10111E htim 
ai lia 

HEREFORD & DIMMITT 647.2189 
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More farmers 
head for D.C. 

Basketball calendar 
IN ADDITION to producing 

shade and lumber, trees car. 
reduce noise levels and can 
serve as giant air cleaners, 
filtering out dust as well as 
using up carbon dioxide and 
giving off oxygen 

there' 
8—Varsity boys vs. Vega, 

there' 

NAZARETH 
Thursday: 
2:30-8th girls vs. Farwell in 

Springlake-Earth Tourney 
3:45-8th boys vs. Farwell in 

S-E Tourney 
Friday: 
1-7th girls vs. Olton in Can-

yon Tournament 
5—JV boys vs. Happy, here' 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Happy. 

here' 
8—Varsity boys vs. Happy 

here' 
(tournaments continue) 
Saturday: 
(tournaments continue) 
Monday: 
5-8th girls vs. Valley, here' 
6-8th boys vs. Valley, here' 
Tuesday: 
5—JV boys vs. Valley, here' 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Valley, 

here' 
8—Varsity boys vs. Valley, 

here' 

DIM MITT 
Thursday: 
4-8th B girls vs. Hart 8th in 

Hart Tournament 
5:15-8th B boys vs. Hart 8th 

in Hart Tournament 
Friday: 
4 —JV girls vs. Friona, there* 
5 —JV boys vs. Friona, there* 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Friona, 

there* 
8—Varsity boys vs. Friona, 

there' 
Saturday: 
(finals in Hart tourney) 
Monday: 
5-7th boys vs. Muleshoe, 

here* 
5-8th boys vs. Muleshoe, 

here° 
7-9th boys vs. Muleshoe, 

here' 
6-7th girls vs. Muleshoe, 

there' 
6-8th girls vs. Muleshoe, 

there' 
7-9th girls vs. Muleshoe, 

there' 
Tuesday: 
4—JV girls vs. Olton, there' 
5—JV boys vs. Olton, there* 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Olton, 

there' 
8—Varsity boys vs. Olton, 

there' 

By TEENY BOWDEN weekend. They won a third 
place, a fourth, fifth, seventh, 
ninth and 11th place and 
Kevin was in the run-Off com-
petition for showmanship. He 
lost out to Cary Sawyer of 
Earth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald El-
kins, Mr. and Mrs. Hershel 
Wilson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lonnie Wilson left for Wash-
ington, D.C. Friday morning 
to join the farmers already 
there in the farm strike move-
ment. Samantha stayed with 
her grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Phillip Jones. Daneen 
stayed with Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Phelan. 

• 

• 
Mrs. Cliff Brown attended 

the meeting of the Association 
of W's in Dimmitt Tuesday 
night. She was elected vice-
president and chairman of the 
legislative research commit-
tee. 

Mrs. Embree Roy Sadler 
and Mrs. L. B. Bowden at-
tended the Castro County 
Genealogical Society meeting 
in Rhoads Memorial Library 
in Dimmitt Thursday night. 

Matt Gilbreath and the 
Dimmit JV team lost to Mor-
ton by one point Tuesday 
night and won over Littlefield 
Friday night. 

Jeffery Jones and Lyle 
Loudder and the Springlake-
Earth eighth grade team won 
second place in the Bovine 
tournament recently. 

Alan Shive of Denver City 
spent the weekend with Noah 
and Ruth Spencer and Lyle 
Shive, and attended the Sun-
day morning church services 
with them. 

Lilt a good neighbor, 

State Farm is dsere. 
State Farm Insurance Companies 

Hare Offices Bloomington, 1111nob 

RESERVE GRAND CHAMPION lamb at the 
	before being chosen as the reserve champion 

National Western Stock Show in Denver 	of the show. Cheryl is the daughter of Mr. 
recently was this middle-weight cross ex- 	and Mrs. Ted Robb, and is a member of the 
hibited by Cheryl Robb of Dimmitt The lamb 

	
Dimmitt 4-H Club. Four other Castro County 

won first place in the middle-weight cross 	youths placed in the National Western show. 
category, then was named the champion cross 

	
(Photo by Jean Robb) 

Hart tourney starts Thursday 
games will play at 7:45 p.m. 
Saturday, and the losers at 
5:15 p.m. Saturday. 

Three trophies will be given 
in each division—for first, 
second and consolation. 

The concession stand will 
be manned by members of the 
Hart Athletic Booster Club. 

Cotton Center 8th at 6:30 
p.m. The winners of the two 
games will play at 6:30 p.m. 
Saturday, with the losers 
playing each other at 4 p.m. 
Saturday. 

The boys' division will start 
action at 5:15 p.m. today with 
Hart 8th playing Dimmitt 8th 
B. Then, Hart 7th will play 
Cotton Center 8th at 7:45 
p.m. The winners of the two 

...and Beet Top Defoliators 
_ Models 34 & 65 

HART 
Thursday: 
4-8th girls vs. Dimmitt 8th B 

in Hart Tournament 
5:15-8th boys vs. Dimmitt 

8th B in Hart Tournament 
6:30-7th girls vs. Cotton 

Center 8th in Hart Tourney 
7:45-7th boys vs. Cotton 

Center 8th in Hart Tourney 
Friday: 
5:30—JV girls vs. Farwell, 

there' 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Far-

well, there' 
8—Varsity boys vs. Farwell, 

there' 
Saturday: 
(finals in Hart tourney) 
Monday: 
4-7th girls vs. Springlake-

Earth, there 
5-7th boys vs. Springlake-

Earth, there 
6-8th girls vs. Springlake-

Earth, there 
7-8th boys vs. Springlake-

Earth, there 
Tuesday: 
5:30—JV boys vs. Vega, 

there' 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Vega, 

Tech students 
from county 
earn honors 

The fall semester honor roll 
from Texas Tech University 
shows the names of 19 Dim-
mitt students and two from 
Nazareth on the dean's list, 
which includes students with 
an average of 3 or more grade 
points on a scale of 4. 

Those from Dimmitt are 
Stephen Anthony, Scott Bag-
well, James G. Cleavinger, 
Beth Cleveland, Melony Dow-
ell, Stanley Harris, Flo Lust, 
Kim Miller, Nancy Robertson, 
Cynthia Sadler, Cheryl Sam-
mann, Cynthia Sides, Barry 
Smithson, Linsae Snider, 
Marvin Spinhirne, Linda 
Street, Brenda Underwood, 
Kathleen Wales and Loretta 
G. Young. 

The honor students from 
Nazareth are Rita Pohlmeier 
and Glenn Kleman. 

Acizummimemonacimme_111111MrS1311S151,1131112 

Society changes 
meeting dates 

A change in meeting dates 
for the Castro County Genea-
logical Society was adopted at 
the January meeting last 
Thursday night. For the con-
venience of more members, 
meetings will be held on sec-
ond Thursday nights each 
month instead of third Thurs-
days. 

The first meeting of 1978 
got the year off to a good start 
with 10 members and two vis-
itors attending. New members 
and visitors are invited to all 
meetings, which begin at 7 
p.m. 

South Nazareth Farm Store, Inc. 
Exclusive He 	Deafer for Castro County 

2 aka ..e• of Matirata •• FM 1411 

Here's Hart's 
school menu 

Here are the school lunch 
menus for Hart schools for 
Jan. 20-Feb. 3. 

MONDAY — Burritos, 
crackers, tossed salad, new 
potatoes in cheese sauce, pea-
nut butter cake and milk. 

TUESDAY — Chili beans, 
cornbread, mixed greens, 
pickled beets, cookies and 
milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Sloppy 
Joes on homemade buns, 
ranch style beans, pickles, 
onions, applesauce and milk. 

THURSDAY — Fried fish, 
tartar sauce, cornbread, cole 
slaw, blackeyed peas, white 
cake and milk. 

FRIDAY — Roast beef, 
brown gravy, hot rolls, green 
beans, whipped potatoes, ap-
ple cobbler and milk. 

..•••••••11. :::••••••• 	111 III O-=1 I I thlo. 
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Ladies & 
Chidrens 

SHOES 
Values $097 
to $10°0 	pr. 

)1‘  

3/$10w 
1. 

adi • 

(4 

iE 

Mae 

pr. 

Junior 

OVERALLS 
By Famous Makers 

Reg. moo Value 

$1288  

Mens 

COVERALLS 
Reg. $13°' Value 

Now 488 

••* 
	10 

4 

Special 
Selection Of 

Mons 

WESTERN BOOTS 
Values to $5900  

1988  

Ladies 
t\\' Polyester Knit 

GAO 

0 

Ida 
SHELLS 

Long Sleeve 

$5"1 $297  se Now ea. 

1.00' 
• & 

4, 11111imuft. 

• 
• 
4 I I 

I 

YARN 
k 	Al In Stock 

(No Special Orders) 

Reg. '1" 00C 
Skein gg Skein 

Wintuck By Coats & Clark 

.000- 	• 

Be Sure /I, 

To See The 	II 

1/2  Price Table 
Items From Al Departments 

Luggage - Purses • Tops -

Jeans & Many More Items. 

1.00011,  • •i 
  

Take Your Cotton 
to Your 

Co-Op Gin 

We appreciate 
your business. 

CASTRO 
CO-OP GIN II r"—= 0 	II 0 

is 	411e 
0 

III  

II'•""*" 0111i 

1 

Ho 
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CABLE TV 

BETTER PICTURE, 
MORE STATIONS! 

A Cable hook-up 

makes TV pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

DIMMITT 

TV CABLE CO. 
NO INSTALLATION 

CHARGE 

Phone 647-2364 

P L6  hone 
47-2301 Dimmitt 

	A W 

ANNOUNCING 
A NEW FARM BUREAU 

TO SERVICE YOUR TIRE, BATTERY AND 
TILLAGE TOOL NEEDS 

Have you tried 
SAFEMARK PRODUCTS? 

Why Don't You 
Try One Today! 

G & S SUPPLY 
Box 995, Dimmitt, Texas 79027 
Phone: 647-2502 or 647-4544 

DISC 
BLADES CHISEL 	 NOTCHED 

SPIKES 

CHISEL 
SWEEPS 

*TILLAGE TOOLS ARE 
AVAILABLE THROUGH 

THIS AGENT ONLY. 

The sooner you order, the more you save 

CHIEF BIN 
WINTER DISCOUNTS 

Order a Chief Grain Management System 
now and get ahead three ways: (1) you'll have 
installation out of the way before the busy sea-
son; (2) you'll realize extra income from every 
crop because it's a proven fact that on-the-farm 
drying and storage increases income; and (3) 
you save with substantial winter discounts 
which are now in effect. 	• 

Here's the deal on Chief winter discount: 
the sooner you order, the bigger the discount. 
Time literally is money. 

Remember, you can't buy a better built bin 
Heavy gauge steel. Vertical stiffeners. Bolt-free, 
interlocking roof panels. Wide 30" top cones. 
Double-row hill arid valley bolting. And a com-
plete drying installation if desired. 

Approved for ASCS Loans 
15% Down - 8 yr. Term - 7% Interest 

WESTERN AG 
SALES CO., INC. 

Broadway at Belsher 

Dimmitt 	647-3188 

,P,HRFIr 

COW POKES By Ace Reid 

"Jake I promise if you wont blow any more 
smoke in my face, I ain't gonna spit any 

tobaccer juice in yores!" 

MEMBER OF FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 

• 

eACc is 
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HE WHO loveth a book will 
never want a faithful friend, a 
wholesome counsellor, a 
cheerful companion, or an ef-
fectual comforter. -Barrow 
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States. Married women re-
turning to the labor force is 
the chief cause. 

THERE are more multiple-
earner families than single-
earner families in the United Here's how city will use 

its RS funds during year 
set  

01  

Castro County among 
Texas top 10 in wheat 

Castro County was among 
the top 10 wheat producing 
counties in Texas in 1977, 
Agriculture 	Commissioner 
Reagan V. Brown said today. 

With a total harvest of 3,-
508,400 bushels, Castro Coun-
ty produced 3 percent of the 
wheat grown in the state, 
Brown said. 

r'
•'
•'

•  
t'

s
.r

  

a disaster command post," 
Holland said, "but we can't 
do that now, with the budget 
cut from $25,000 down to 
$2,575. Maybe next year..." 

HEALTH: $5,500 Current 
allocation. Of this amount, 
$1,260 has been "pigeon-
holed" for an extra mosquito-
spraying this summer if need-
ed; $240 is to pay the city 
health officer's salary of $20 
per month during the year; 
and $4,000 is for a new "Em-
ergency Health Services for 
the Indigent" fund. 

The $4,000 Emergency 
Health Services fund was set 
up by public demand at the 
final hearing to serve as a 
"drawing fund" for poor peo-
ple who could not afford ad-

-mission deposits at Plains 
Memorial Hospital. It is to be 
used only for emergency ser-
vice, and anyone who with-
draws money from the fund is 
supposed to repay it so the 
service can continue. Other 
aspects of the fund-such as 
who is to authorize payment, 
what the maximum withdraw-
al can be for any individual, 
etc.-are still to be worked 
out by the mayor, hospital 
officials and city commission-
ers. 

this Capital allocation is ear-
marked for resurfacing the 
tennis courts and adding new 
picnic tables and benches at 
the present park. 

POLICE: $7,800 Current, 
$5,725 Capital. The $7,800 is 
to pay the salary of one of the 
three radio dispatchers at the 
sheriff's office, in return for 
dispitching service and use of 
the county jail. The $5,725 
Capital allocaiton is for a new 
patrol car, which has already 
been ordered. 

SANITATION: 	$35,000 
Capital allocation to purchase 
a new one-man garbage truck 
to service the city's trash 
boxes. This purchase will give 
the city two garbage trucks 
for better scheduling and 
more frequent trash pick-ups. 

SENIOR CITIZENS: $3,400 
Current, $4,000 Capital. The 
current allocation is to pay the 
year's utility bills at the Sen-
ior Citizens' Center during 
the year, and the $4,000 is to 
help toward the purchase of a 
building for the Castro County 
Senior Citizens, Inc. 

"None of this money goes 
to these projects and organi-
zations in lump sums," Hol-
land explained. "These are 
budgeted amounts which the 
city will pay as bills are re-
ceived and expenses are jus-
tified by the various organiza-
tions." 

GOOD 
VOLUME 

DISCOUNTS 
on CORN and MILO seed 

*Smut Resistant 
•Standability-low stalk rot 
•Good Production 
•Easy to Harvest 

ASK ABOUT OUR 'FAR NORTH' 
CANADIAN FISHING TRIP! 

Of the 126,000 acres plant-
ed in wheat, Castro County 
farmers harvested 11,900 ac-
res, and realized a 31.6-bush-
el per acre average yield, he 
noted. 

The state's winter wheat 
production for 1977 totaled 
117,500,000 bushels. This 
boosted Texas into the No. 6 
spot in the nation in total 
wheat production, Brown 
commented. 

He stated that the low 
wheat prices which accom-
panied this near-record pro-
duction have hurt Texas farm-
ers, particularly in the face of 
rising production costs. 
"However, Texas farmers 

will receive a substantial 
share of the $1.2 billion in 
federal wheat deficiency pay-
ments that will be paid out 
this year," Brown noted. 
"This should help ease the 
serious cash-flow problems 
our farmers have experienced 
because of the low grain 
prices." 

Electric coop 
gets REA loan 

Pork producers 
slate symposium 

A pork symposium dealing 
with energy and efficiency in 
pork facilities will be conduct-
ed at West Texas State Un-
iversity's Activities Center 
Friday for area pork produc-
ers, sponsored by the Texas 
Pork Producers, regional as-
sociations of pork producers 
and WTSU. 

Swine breeders are con-
cerned about their facilities 
and use of fuel, according to 
Dr. Charles Smallwood, dean 
of the WTSU School of Ag-
riculture. 

The one-day program, plan-
ned with the assistance of the 
swine breeders organization 
in West Texas, will feature a 
variety of speakers from 
across the country. 

Building and utilizing waste 
products will be the topic of 
the morning session, schedul-
ed for 9 'a.m. Dr. Dwaine 
Bundey, Iowa State University 
agriculture engineer and 
swine building specialist, will 
discuss new developments in 
building and remodeling. 

Marketing and production 
problems for producers will 
be the theme of the afternoon 
session. Dr. Fred Madden of 
the US Department of Agri-
culture Inspection Service and 
Dr. Tom Snodgrass of the 
Federal Department of Agri-
culture will speak. 

  

DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

(formerly Webb-Mears 
Engine] 

*King Offset Discs 
•Briggs & Stratton 
Sales & Service 

•Allis-Chalmers 
Phone 647-2573 

P.O. Box 576 

  

Building 

Material for 

Every purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM 
BARTLETT CO. 

  

     

 

FARMER'S 
SUPPLY CO. 

THE FINEST IN 

Minneapolis-Moline 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO 

REPAIR 

 

 

HOW'S YOUR CREDIT 

We'll be happy to answer 
your questions on the 
importance of a good 

credit record. 
Call us or stop in for a 

personal interview. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
116 W. Bedford 

     

  

HAYS 

IMPLEMENT 

CO. 

International-Harvester 

Farm Machinery 

City sales 
tax check 
is received 

INSECTICIDES: 	$4,949 
Current allocation. This 
amount is set aside to pay for 
four aerial applications of 
mosquito spray over the city 
during the summer, at a cost 
of more than $1,200 per 
spraying. (The city sprayings 
also include lakes near the 
city, the Country Club golf 
course and lake, and the city 
sewer plant.) Money for a 
fifth spraying, if necessary, is 
set aside in the Health bud-
get. 

LIBRARY: $10,800 Current 
allocation. This money, along 
with a matching amount from 
the county, goes into a library 
subsidy fund that is admin-
istered by the Castro County 
Library Board. It can be used 
to underwrite salaries, pur-
chase supplies, or for other 
current expenses of Rhoads 
Memorial Library. 

MUSEUM: $2,000 Current, 
$2,000 Capital. The current 
allocation is to pay for utilities 
tlt the city-county museum 
during the coming year. The 
Capital allocation is for the 
purchase of permanent mu-
seum improvements, as ap-
proved by the board of di-
rectors of the Castro County 
Historical Museum Associa-
tion. 

MENTAL HEALTH-MEN-
TAL RETARDATION: $3,800 
Current allocation, to help pay 
rent, caretaking expenses and 
utilities for the MH/MR Out-
reach Center in Dimmitt. This 
money also goes into a joint 
city-county fund to make the 
services of the Central Plains 
Mental Health/Mental Re-
tardation Center at Plainview 
available to Castro County 
residents through a local of-
fice. 

PARKS: $6,800 Current, 
$22,500 Capital. The $6,800 is 
to pay for maintenance of the 
city park during the year-
two maintenance workers at 
$50 per month each during 
the winter and $75 per month 
each during the summer, plus 
money for spraying of trees 
and shrubs. 

With the $22,500 Capital al-
location, the city hopes to 
build a new park in Northwest 
Dimmitt so children in that 
part of the city can go to a 
public park without having to 
cross a highway. Also, part of 

An REA loan to Swisher 
Electric Cooperative, which 
serves an area including part 
of Castro County, is announc-
ed by Congressman George 
Mahon. The loan is for $771,-
000 at 5 percent interest. 

Purpose of this loan is to 
finance service for 382 addi-
tional consumers, 92 miles of 
distribution lines, 7 miles of 
transmission line and systems 
improvements. 

Based in Tulia, the coop 
serves parts of Hale and 
Castro Counties as well as 
Swisher County. 

After public hearings and 
budget revisions, here's how 
the City of Dimmitt will use 
its $122,249 in federal Rev-
enue Sharing funds through 
Sept. 30, 1978. 

$57,634 of the total amount 
was received from Jan. 1 
through Sept. 30, 1977, and is 
already on deposit. The re-
maining $64,615 is being re-
ceived in quarterly allocations 
from the federal government 
from Oct. 1, 1977, to Sept. 30, 
1978. 

The budget is broken into 
"Current" and -Capital" ex-
penditures. Current expendi-
tures are for ongoing operat-
ing expenses of various pro-
grams of the city, and Capital 
expenditures are for major 
purchases of equipment or 
property during the fiscal 
year. 

The Revenue Sharing bud-
get breakdown, as explained 
by City Manager Garnett Hol-
land: 

AMBULANCE: $5,400 cur-
rent, to pay one-third of the 
anticipated deficit for public 
ambulance service during the 
year. The county and hospital 
district each pay a matching 
amount. The money goes into 
a fund which pays for am-
bulance upkeep, drivers' sal-
aries of $125 per month, etc. 

"This ambulance cost is a 
bargain," Holland comment-
ed. "Other communities are 
having to pay up to $12,000 
per month. Our drivers and 
their employers are holding 
the line for us. They're all 
part-time drivers who rotate 
their on-call days, and their 
employers let them take the 
time to make ambulance calls. 
Otherwise, we'd have to hire 
full-time drivers." 

CIVIL DEFENSE: $2,575 
Capital allocation, to be used 
as needed in case of torna-
does, blizzards, etc., for pub-
lic safety. 

The term "Civil Defense" 
is gradually being replaced by 
a more accurate designation: 
"Emergency Preparedness," 
which includes all local plans 
for dealing with disasters. 

The original Civil Defense 
allocation was $25,000, but 
nine-tenths of this money was 
sliced off and redistributed to 
other programs, by public 
demand. 

"What we wanted to do 
was start progressing toward 

A check for $6,189.75, rep-
resenting Dimmitt's city sales 
tax allocation for the month 
ending Jan. 5, has been mail-
ed to the city, the state comp-
troller's office reports. 

No payments were sent to 
Nazareth and Hart, since the 
comptroller's office retains a 
specified amount, two per-
cent, of the year's total tax 
plus a small service fee. The 
period allocation for Hart was 
$371.18 and for Nazareth, 
$482.09. 

Checks received by other 
cities in this area include 
$544.10 to Earth, $2,401.97 to 
Friona, $18,273.98 to Here-
ford, $7,075 to Littlefield, 
$5,403.82 to Muleshoe, $1,-
397.62 to Olton, $4,547.82 to 
Tulia. 



GIBSON'S 

6 Pack Returnable Quarts 

SCOPE iced tea 

FARMLAND HAM PATTIES 

Reg. $2" 	$ 199 
PUREX 
BLEACH 

Gallon 
SCOPE 
• 

40 oz. 
New Imperial Size 

Reg. $3" $269 

BUBBLE UP, 
MOUTAIN DEW 

& NESTEA 
ICE TEA 

6 Pack °f  
12 oz. Cans 

99c 
RIT 

CONCENTRATED 
TINT & 

DYE 

All Colors 

Reg. 49` 

MURINE 
1.5 oz. 

Reg. s2" 

$99 

MENNEN 
SOF' STROKE 

SHAVE CREAM 

Reg. $1'9  
11 oz. 99. 

SELSUN BLUE 
DANDRUFF 
SHAMPOO 

8 oz. 

$259 
SUAVE 

CREME RINSE 
All Fragrances 

Reg. sr 
16 oz. 99C 

REGAL POLY-PERK POTTING SOIL & 
PEAT MOSS 

1/3   OFF 
COFFEE MAKER rib' 
24 Cup 

$597 Reg. sr 

GULFPRIDE, Single G 
PENNZOIL , SAE 20 

HAVOLINE 

REMINGTON 
SHELLS 

Duck/Pheasant Loads 
12 or 20 Guage 

45 RPM 
TOP 50 

SINGLES 
Reg.'1"  99c 
• 

$349 
Choice 
Your 	9c 

OR 12/0600  

PRESTONE 
ANTI-FREEZE 

$319 
Gallon 

HUNTING POCKET KNIVES 

IA OFF 
GREETING CARDS 	STUFFED ANIMALS 

25% OFF 1/ 2  OFF 
New Shipment 

INFANT & 
TODDLERS CLOTHES 

SPARTUS 
WALL CLOCKS 

1/3  OFF ALL 
COLOGNES 

& PERFUMES 
Brut - Mon Triomphe • loran 

Ambush • Aviance Jontue 

25% OFF 

TIMEX 
WATCHES 

10% OFF ALL ZIPPERS, THREADS 
& BIAS TAPE 

40% OFF 
Shop 

Now & 

Save 

In Bearden Shopping Center 	Phone 6474108 

Mon. thru Fri. 9:00 a.m. to 7:30 p.m. 

Saturday 9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD JANUARY 25 THRU FEBRUARY 2 

DURATION 
NASAL 
SPRAY 

Up to 

12 Hours Relief 
Y2 fl. oz. 
Reg. sl. 

$129 

Duration  
NrArSPRAY 

5, up tau hour relief 
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Dimmitt Business and Industrial Review 
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a 1 STORM DOOR BARGAINS! .12 E= 	 -1 
m 	Two-Window Storm Door 	INI 
DO 	 Oa.  on 	1 1/4  inches thick, aluminum finish, 	OC 
0E) 	two windows with tempered glass. 

MI 
DO 	2-8 x 6-8 and 3-0 x 6-8, right or left 
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opening. 	 00 

	

Only $s450  Each 	
CM 
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00 	 00 
00 	Full-View Storm Door 	DO 

11/4 	inches thick, 	bronze or white 	Ili 
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s,  Complete Body Repair 

WALLET 	9c 9 	 ct  
PORTRAITS 

Get pictures made of Grandpa, 

Grandma, Dad, Mom and all the 

Little Ones at these same low prices! 

Ask about our FREE 8x10 offer! 

Western Auto 
113 W. Bedford 	647.2640 

President of 

Farm 

304 

Meet 

JACK 

GALE 

Castro County 

Bureau 
W. FLYNT, 

Agency Manager 

N. Broadway 

SADLER 

Farm Bureau 

Insurance 
C.L.U. 

647.3420 

❑beginning 

fr,  Auto Painting 

A,  Auto & Cab Glass 

v Fiberglass Work 

Estimates gladly given 	before 	 any 
work on your car . .. foreign or domestic. We 
handle all insurance claims promptly! 

Ford Body Shop 
DONNIE WELTY, MGR. 

206 E. Etter 	 647-5533 

CI 	 00 C caA Nu i  k i  ng  — 	DO L Es
tripping 

G - D
and 

Bs 	
weather 

D. 	silicone, latex and butyl rubber 	pa 
0 	 UM 09 Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. • as 
LOUDOD NI Kai= L_11_1_3 NE mott=looto=o=00000  

TOOL SALE 

8-Ton Hydraulic Jacks 	 $20 
11-Piece Combination Wrench Set 	$19.95 
14-Piece Combination Wrench Set 	$29.95 
Screwdriver Sets 	  $3.00 & $3.75 
Deep Socket Sets (8) 	  $8.95 & $15.95 
51-Piece Socket Wrench Set. $35 
24-Piece 1/2-In. Socket Wrench Set 	  $35 
Impact Sockets (Set of 11) 	  $16.95 
2-Ton Come-Along 	  $24.95 
Small Sledge Hammers 	 $5 & $8 
Bench Vises 	  .. $7.50 & $29.00 

• 

SAVE on individual tools by LeverWrench, Fuller, 
Buffalo 

Dimmitt Welding & Electric 

E. Hwy 86 	 647-3128 

Early 

You'll get ONE-STOP 
cotton crops when you 
SEED, a good supply 
complete line of FERTILIZERS. 

We're stocked, geared 
YOU MONEY AND 

Stop in at 	any of 
Woodard, 	manager), 
ELEVATOR (Army Armstrong, 
SONS WEST (N.C. 

of 

our 
on 

White, 

QUAL 

TIME. 

Bruegel 
We're 

ALL MAJOR 
READY 

Booking 

SERVICE on 
deal with Bruegel 
all popular CHEMICALS 

and equipped 

Highway 

Jr., manager) 

PROUD 

Best Grainmen 

three locations—Bruegel 

manager), 

FOR BOOKING 

planning 
& Sons. 

to give you 

385 	north; 
north 

& Sons, 
TO Be Serving 

in the 

WSEED 
VARIETIES, 

on Highway 

your 1978 
We 

at very 

& 
BRUEGEL 
of Tam 

Nation! 

Discount! 

COMPLETE 

corn, milo, soybean and 
have all major varieties of 

competitive prices, and a 

service, and SAVE 

Sons MAIN OFFICE (Ed 
BROTHERS GIN & 

Anne; and BRUEGEL & 
86 west. 

Inc. 
the 

DYER 

WELL SERVICE 	• 

*Submersible Pump 

Sales and Service 

*Domestic Wells Drilled 

Call 647-2366 

CB: "Waft:. Man" 	
, 

Beautify Your Home 

the Easy Way with 

STYROFOAM CEILING TILE, 

PRE-FINISHED PANELING, 

PRE-FINISHED MOULDINGS 

and 

COLOR-MATCHED NAILS 

from 

KILLINGSWORTH 

Builders Supply 

S. Hwy. 385 

647.3141 

Your Bank of 
FULL 

FriendlyA Service 
Checking Accounts 	Customer Safekeeping 

Savings Accounts 	Loans 

Individual 	Retirement 	Trust Department 
Accounts 

Safety Deposit Boxes 
Certificates of Deposit 

Bank-by-Mail 
Money Orders 

Drive-In Banking 
Traveler's Checks 

walk up Banking 
Savings Bonds 

24-Hour Night Depos- 
Visa & Master Charge 	itory 

 

The First State Bank 
of Dimmitt 

647.4151 

$2299 Casual
CDmfortably 

for a traditional 

lifestyle. 
,r-- 	 11you re a man whose 

traditional look, thisFlush 
Puppies' casual is a fitting 
accessory Subtle styling 
provides a comfortable con- 
fidence—always right in 
tune with your lifestyle 
And traditional in value. toOl 

• Hush 
ntititiet.: 

ALL 

FOR 

early 

BRUEGEL 

SEE 

Ask 

PLANTING 
AVAILABLE 

booking 

us 

US 
VARIETIES 

ELEVATOR 

about 

BOOKING 

& 

FOR 

discount. 

SEEDS 

an 
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OF 
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PAINT 
JOHN 
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STANFORD 
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BODY 

-OWNER 

R 
SHOP e  

Behrends Insurance 

it 
With down-to-earth 
talk about insurance 
and low rates 

Just call 647-3176 

or come by 113 

Aiistatr 

to 

easier. 

E. 

match. 

Agency 

Bedford. 

........„ 
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: 
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MOST MODERN EQUIPMENT 

Featuring 

Frome-Straightening 

If your vehicle 

we'll BUY 

• COMPLETE GLASS 

• BODY & FENDER 

-24 HOUR 

Ktrif 

._._._.cA,u___ 

":a17,-4 Ilil, 
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 • 
I 	• 

IN THE AREA 

Our Unique  

Equipment 

is totaled, 

or REPAIR it! 

WORK 

REPAIR & REPAINTING 

WRECKER 

16523 	 Breatidn' Brushed 

Pig Skin 

Casual Shoos 

1/4... 
-YES,WE DO WRITE 

Dimmitt, 

Tom 

iy, 	. 	1 
tefffiiii/#1. 

, 	C 	0 	ANTHON s 	C 	—1 

- 	,:ir  

647-4426 
INSURANCE TOO! If N. Mawr Call 647-4217 

505 SE 3rd 	 Dirnmitt 
A 	  



Day 19" 
ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

BUILDING 
MATERIALS 
CAPABLE— 

DEPENDABLE 

Phone 938-2183 
Hart and Tuba 

• • 

Kent Birdwell 
116 E. Jones St. 
Phone 647-3427 
Dimmltt Texas 

.!rrll 	 ( • 

TAILWATER PITS CLEANED 
Front-end Loader Style 

Mumme Excavating 
Nazareth 

945-2255 
Nights or Early Morning 

ALLUPIS 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

• BOO CHICKEN 	• BOO RIBS 
• HOT LINKS 	• MILD LINKS 
• BURRITOS 	• CORN DOGS 

• GERMAN SAUSAGE *BULK BOG BEEF 
• BBQ BEEF SANDWICHES 

CONDENSED STATEMENT OF CONDITION 

I7A u,11 

•BANK FARMERS STATE  BANK 
HART, TEXAS 

AGRICULTURE FEEDS YOU THREE TIMES A DAY 

__FAF'3IERS STATE BANK 
HART, TEXAS 

AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS OF DECEMBER 30, 1977 

ASSETS 	 December 31, 1974 

Cash and Due From Banks 	$2,248,035.79 

Loans and Discounts 	 2,391,860.18 

Funds Sold 	  3,600,000.00 

December 31, 1975 

$ 1,927,763.07 

4,417,467.94 

4,100,000.00 

987,410.67 

65,941.63 

60,572.62 

147,732.13 

Bonds and Securities 

Banking House 	 

Furniture and Fixtures 

Other Assets 	 

Letter of Credit 	 -0- 

699,658.90 

67,981.63 

22,056.97 

93,246.29 

100,000.00 

December 30, 1976 December 30, 1977 

	

$ 2,491,549.07 	$ 3,195,393.29 

	

4,997,538.36 	5,706,440.56 

	

5,100,000.00 	6,850,000.00 

	

1,561,091.72 	3,694,062.21 

	

63,541.63 	268,199.80 

	

85,351.33 	 95,383.59 

	

453,836.15 	346,562.26 

-0- 	 -0- 

TOTAL ASSETS 	 $9,222,839.76 $1 1,706,888.06 $14,752,908.26 	$20,156,041.71 

LIABILITIES 

Deposits 	  $8,389,036.27 

Capital 	. 	 200,000.00 

Surplus  	200,000.00 

Undivided Profits & Reserves 	320,992.12 

Letter of Credit  	100,000.00 

Other Liabilities . 	 12,811.37 

$13,680,122.60 

350,000.00 

350,000.00 

331,066.82 

$10,873,475.01 

300,000.00 

300,000.00 

200,629.55 

$18,946,643.78 

350,000.00 

350,000.00 

465,953.66 

-0- 	 -0- 	 -0- 

32,783.50 41,718.84 	 43,444.27 

TOTAL LIABILITIES 	 $9,222,339.76 $11,706,888.06 $14,752,908.26 	$20,156,041.71 

OFFICERS 

JAMES H. WERNER 

President 

GENE HUNTSINGER 
Executive Vice President 

R. CHARLES RICHMOND 

Vice President and- Casbiet 

JONALYN JONES 

Vice President 
MEMBER 

Mig 

DIRECTORS 

GEORGE E. BENNETT 

WISTER CLEVENGER 

GARLAND DE PRANG 

JIM T. HAIR 

EDWARD L. HARRIS 

GENE HUNTSINGER 

MELVIN TEKELL 

JAMES H. WERNER 

Albert Davila, formerly of 
Dimmitt, will challenge Carlos 
Zarate for the World Boxing 
Club bantamweight champ-
ionship Feb. 25. 

The title bout will be tele-
cast live on ABC's Wide 
World of Sports from the 
Forum in Los Angeles. 

Davila, who was known as 
"Tweety" here, lived in Dim-
mitt until he was about 11 
years old, and played in the 
junior baseball program. He 
now resides in Pomona, ,Calif. 

Davila, 22, is the son cif Mr. 
and Mrs. Procolo "Joe" Da-
vila, and is the nephew of 
T.D. Davila Sr. and the cousin 
of T.D. Davila Jr., both of 
Dimmitt. 

The scheduled 15-round 
fight will be promoted by Don 
King. WBC-ranked No. 3, 
Davila will receive $57,500 
and Zarate, a native of Mex-
ico, will receive $75,000 for 
the fight. 

Zarate is undefeated, and 
48 out of 49 of his pro fights 
have ended in knockouts. This 

[Compiled from the Commun-
ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth Am-
erican Legion Auxiliary.] 

JAN. 26 — David Gregory, 
Donald Wright. Geneva Jus-
tice, Coby Moke, Michael 
Robinson, Jimmy Huseman, 
Darryl Birkenfeld. 

JAN. 27 — J. R. Brown, 
Greg Sides, Marlene Vande-
grift, Roxanne Birkenfeld, 
Joyce Lynn Birkenfeld, Earl 
Backus. 

JAN. 28 — Debra Sava, 
Tom Keel, Johnny Hampton, 
Jan Ramaekers, Annette 
Hoelting, Herman Birkenfeld. 

JAN. 29 — Deborah Mo-
hon, Kylie Maples, Kellie 
Maples, Mary Louise Stone, 
Fred Bruegel Sr., Jean Schul-
te, Kerry Brockman. 

JAN. 30 — Twila West, Tif-
fany Wilcox, Clint Ross Robi-
son, Bryan Gregory. 

JAN. 31 — Mary Nell Ma-
lone, Louise Cathey, Oneeta 
Cole, Mitzie Golden, Ysleta 
Ball, Mac Langford, Don Har-
grove, Stanley McDaniel, 
Glenn Odom, Marvin Jones, 
Thomas Braddock, Elmer 
Schulte. 

FEB. 1 — Zonell Maples. 
Donnette Wait, George Bo-
wen, Randall Cantrell, Lori 
Gerber, Glenda Ehly, Chris 
Venhaus, Vincent Pohlmeier, 
Marion Hoelting. 

FEB. 2 — Becky Hand, 
Janet Sammann, Inez Lee, 
Carla Carpenter, Tresa Pow-
ell, Dustan Buckley, Henry 
Howell, Eric Mays, Cody Phil-
lips, Kenneth Thompson, 
Dorothy Lange, Dale Wil-
helm, Mark Gerber, Robert 
Hutton. 

Correction 
In last week's News it was 

erroneously stated that the 
exercise classes set up by the 
Town and Country Home Ex-
tension Club were to be led by 
Margo Boyd, but the leader is 
Jo Thurston, a physical ed-
ucation teacher in Dimmitt 
Middle School. 

Mrs. Boyd, however, is the 
one to call if any are in-
terested in joining the class. 
Her phone number is 647-
2601. 

iburaday, January 26, 1978 
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Family may apply 	Christian broadcast 
programs resumed 

to host AFS student 

WITHOUT the love of 
books the richest man is poor; 
bet endowed with this treas-
ste of treasures, the poorest 
aeon is rich. 	—Gutterman 

Total Christian Radio, 
KWAS FM, Amarillo, is back 
on the air after closing several 
days for necessary technical 
repairs and installation of a 
new transmission line. 

By BRICK AUTRY 
Librarian 

Information about require-
ments for hosting a student 
may be obtained from Mrs. 
Bell, 647-4671, or from any of 
the families here who have 
acted as hosts in the past. 

The American Field Service 
is looking for host family ap-
plicants for the next school 
year, so Dimmitt can bring a 
student from a foreign coun-
try to attend high school 
during the 1978-79 term. 

Students from countries 
over the world have lived in 
Dimmitt under the AFS pro-
gram, enriching the communi-
ty with their accounts of other 
ways of life, Janice Bell, pres-
ident of the local AFS chap-
ter, points out. 

Anne Helderweirt of Bel-
gium is the present AFS stu-
dent here, living in the Jack 
Miller home. 

Host families are usually 
those with children in high 
school, but this is not a re-
quirement, Mrs. Bell ex-
plains. The family supplies 
food and lodging for the stu-
dent but other expenses are 
paid by the AFS, the com-
munity and the student's own 
family or community. 

Dimmitt's part of the ex-
pense comes from the United 
Way and high school classes 
and organizations. 

After the student has been 
in the community long enough 
to get acquainted, he is avail-
able to speak to various or-
ganizations and church 
groups, presenting pictures 
and information about his 
home country. 

FROM ORANGE, near the 
Louisiana border, to Browns-
ville, gateway to Mexico, the 
Texas Gulf Coast is a tourist 
playground and industrial 
center. 

The station closed Jan. 5 
for the work to improve its 
service, according to Paul 
Archival, general manager. It 
broadcasts with 100,000 watts 
of power to cover a five-state 
region with a succession of 
Christian programs. 

In early India, where they 
were supposedly invented, 
they were round. Later, when 
the Hungarians brought them 
to Europe, there were four 
suits—rods, coins, swords 
and cups. Each suit had ten 
cards and a knight, jack, and 
queen and king. In Germany, 
later still, the suits were in 
bells, acorns, swords and 
hearts. In Italy and Spain they 
still use the old suits of rods, 
coins and so forth. The game 
is called tarroche. In the sev-
enteenth century when play-
ing cards came to England 
new suits were adopted which 
we use today. Rods became 
clubs, coins became dia-
monds, cups became hearts 
and swords became spades. 

The tarot pack of cards is 
like the old European cards 
except that they have 22 
picture cards. These extra 
cards have been through 
numerous 	interpretations 
through the years. Some say 
that they go back to the 
ancient Egyptians while oth-
ers say they were copied out 
of classical literature. 

There are several different 
styles of the Tarot deck. The 
most famous deck was printed 
in Marseilles, France. There 
are several modern decks be-
ing printed today. Richard 
Cavendish writes about all of 
them, includes wonderful il-
lustrations and even a chapter 
on fortune-telling giving the 
meaning of each card. 

So if you are in the mood 
for devination, give us a visit.  

Ousl Ammtuni, 

Richard Cavendish is not a 
household name; not unless it 
is a witch's household. An 
author with a delight in the 
occult, he has written several 
landmark items in the field of 
occultism. He is the author of 
"The Black Arts," a standary 
history of occultism, the ser-
ies "Man, Myth, and Mag-
ic," and an encyclopedia of 
the supernatural. 

We here at Rhoads Mem-
orial Library came across one 
of his new books which is 
colorful and very alluring (in 
an evil sort of way). The book, 
"The Tarot," is the history of 
the mysterious gypsy fortune 
telling cards. 

The cards, mostly unknown 
to us here in America, have 
enjoyed a revival in recent 
years. They are a distinct part 
of the history of the playing 
cards which we use today. 

Our playing cards went 
through a number of changes. 

ALBERI DAVILA, BANTAMWEIGHT CONTENDER 
. . . Will fight for title on national TV Feb. 25 

Bantam championship 
bout set for Feb. 25 

will be his sixth title defense. 
Davila's overall record of 

26-4 includes 10 knockouts, 
three of which were scored 
among his five victories this 
year. 

"I think Albert has the per-
fect style to beat Zarate," 
said Bennie Georgino, Da-
vila's manager. 

"I usually adjust to an op-
ponent after a fight begins," 
Davila said. "But I know that 
Zarate has a very good left 
hook to the body that he 
doubles up. I'll plan to coun-
ter that. I'll also be in the best 
condition of my life." 

AUCTIONEERS — LIQUIDATORS — APPRAISERS 
SALES MANAGEMENT — REAL ESTATE 

M&A AUCTIONEERS, INC. 

Meade Michael 
	

Dean Sanders 
	

Darroll Adams 
353-5898 
	

938-2217 
	

499-3558 
Amarillo 
	

Hart 
	

Umbarger 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

READ ALL ABOUT DORM 

"Tam ALLSUPS SPECIALS! 
•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••
• 	 • 

FOUNTAIN 	• • 

CUP • • ••* 
• OF 	•• 
• • 
• COKE • • • ••• • •• 

••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

 • • ••••••••••••••••• 

SPECIALS 
GOOD 

JAN. 26-29, 
1978 

COKE GLASSES 
32s:ex. 3/$ 11 	1 

SIZE 
1201. 1 OC ..••••• 

••••111•06 
• 
• 

t- 	 BORDEN NL, 
NUTTY BUDDY 	• 

WILSON'S 

BACON 
ICE CREAM 
SANDWICH 12 OZ. S 09 

PKG. 
BORDEN 

/CHOCOLATE 6 PAK 79c 
BOX 

$129  DRINK 	
GALc • 

0••••••••••••••••••• 

gi. 
4/1. 	SUNSHINE NRISPY 

are CRACKERS 
bg7,, 
1,4J 2 .. 111. 89c HOT LINKS 3/$1 

HOT COOKED FOODS 

ORANGES 

WILSON 
FRANKS 

4 Ls. for

•  

11 

CERTIFIED 	•• 
• 

•: 

•: 

12 °I. 69 PKG. 
• • • 
• 

I 

SO1 W. Bedford, Dimmitt MOP THE FRIENDLY, CONVENIENT 
ALLSUP'S STORE NEAR YOUI 
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JAN. 27, Friday 	  FRIONA, There 

JAN. 31, Tuesday 	 OLTON, There 

FEB. 3, Friday 	 MORTON, Here 

FEB. 7, Tuesday 	LITTLEFIELD, Here 

FEB. 10, Friday 	MULESHOE, There 

FEB. 14, Tuesday 	  FRIONA, Here 

FEB. 17, Friday [Girls] 	 OLTON, Here 

FEB. 21, Tuesday [Girls]... MORTON, There 

73 Channing 40 
75 Hale Center 29 
52 Vega 33 
48 Canyon 49 
59 Slaton 44 
Plainview Tournament: 

86 Post 36 
82 Estacado JV 42 
98 Crosbyton 61 
[Championship] 

74 Adrian 22 
65 Lubbock 68 
56 Tulia 48 
Reese AFB Tournament: 

56 Lovington, N.M. 44 
44 Abilene Cooper 50 
83 Big Spring 50 
[Third Place) 

45 Vega 28 
47 Lubbock 43 
Caprock Tournament: 

80 Lubbock 55 
55 Estacado 54 
43 Dunbar 50 
[Second Place] 

66 Canyon 48 
56 Perryton 47 
96 River Road 45 

79, Olton 28 
55, Morton 42 
48, Littlefield 29 
Record to Date: 21-4  

44 Channing 60 
54 Hale Center 61 
48 Vega 47 
Kress Tournament: 

91 Kress JV 18 
43 Abernathy 54 
69 Kress 44 
[Third Place] 

46 Adrian 32 
Tulle Tournament: 

49 Lockney 56 
72 Farwell 33 
57 Friona 38 
[Consolation] 

65 Tulle 57 
48 Vega 57 
51 Monterey 53 
Amarillo Tournament: 

67 Coronado 38 
46 Vega 48 
42 Coronado 36 
45 Hart 39 
[Third Place) 

71 Dunbar 31 
71 Estacado 22 
73 River Road 41 

74, Lubbock 30 
69, Levelland 64 
69, Littlefield 55 
Record to Date: 16-7 

SUPPORT THE BOOSTERS WHO SUPPORT OUR SCHOOLS, TEAMS AND COMMUNITY! 
C. R. Anthony Co. 

LaMantia, Cullum, Collier & Co., Inc. 
Nelson Drilling & Pump Service 

Kenneth Jackson Ditching Service 
Western Ag Sales Co., Inc. 
Harman's Department Store 

Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet 
Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc. 
Behrends Insurance Agency 

Western Auto 
Dimmitt Consumers, Inc. 
Farm Bureau Insurance 
Jack Flynt, Agent & Manager 

Dimmitt TV Cable Co. 
Dimmitt Super Market 
Bruegel & Sons, Inc. 

Stan Byrnes Ford 
Colonial Inn Restaurant 
Dimmitt Equipment Co. 

Dennis Floral & Gifts 

Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 
Dimmitt Feed Yards 

Production Credit Association 
Tidwell Spraying Service 

George Real Estate 
Sears Catalog Store 

Jack & Clara Patton 

Schumacher Brothers, Custom Farmers 
Dimmitt Appliance Center 
Don Hargrove, Contractor 
Chem-Tex Farm Supply 
Riverside Chemical Co. 

Goodpasture, Inc. 
Farmers Supply Co. 
Flagg Fertilizer Co. 

Flagg Grain Co. 
First State Bank 
Cluck Fertilizer 

Huckabay Abstract 
C&S Equipment Co. 

Five Point Gin 
Ann's Steak House 

Earl's Garage 
The North Gin 

David's Pro Shop 
Tots & Teens 

Justice Real Estate 
CB's Auto Repair 

Cowsert Abstract & Title Co. 
Dimmitt Shell 

K-Bob's Steak House 
Pat's Electric 

Texas Energy Co. 
Hi-Plains Oil Co. 
Bobcat Drive In 

Castro Co-op Gin, Inc. 
Amstar Corporation 

Mr. Burger 
Dimmitt Ready Mix 

Kemp Farms 
George's Exxon Station 
Driver's Mobil Station 
Coleman Pharmacy 

Hays Implement Co. 
Dimmitt Car Wash 

Castro County Grain Co. 
Parsons Rexall Drug 
Dimmitt Safety Lane 

Paxton Tire & Service 
Cowen Insurance Agency 

Joe Ziegler Golf Shop 
The Village Shop 
Big T Pump Co. 

Seale Florist 



M CIHIEL 
ALL 
THE 
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* * 	MICHELIN FIRST 

* 'we don't make a second best 
* 	* * 	* * ~k sir 

ford, Kress, Lazbuddie, Lub-
bock, Nazareth, Plainview, 
Tulia and Umbarger. They 
thank all their friends for 
helping making their open 
house such a success. 

Congratulations to Charlie 
and Juanita Barker on the 
birth of a son Jan. 14. His 
name is Christopher Shawn. 
He is the first grandchild of 
the James Wilhelms. 

Congratulations also to Las-
ry and Ginger Wells on the 
birth of a son named Luke. 

Rudolph and Margaret 
Braddock and Charles and 
Roberta Braddock drove to 
Page, Ariz. to visit their sister 
Ruth Payne who is seriously 
ill. Charles and Roberta stay-
ed with her several days after 
the Rudolph Braddocks re-
turned home. 

Dianna Anderson, bride-
elect of Clayton Acker, was 
honored with a shower at the 
Gold Room of the First State 
Bank in Tulia. Close relatives 
from Nazareth attended. The 
wedding will take place at the 
Baptist Church in Tulia Feb. 
11. 

Joe and Amy Schmucker 
were honored with a dinner 
and party on their 40th wed-
ding anniversary. A large 
number of relatives and 
friends were at the commun-
ity hall in Nazareth to enjoy 
the evening and wish them 
well. 

* 

Jerry Russell and sons Kyle 
and Tyson of Lubbock spent 
two weeks with her parents 
the Jerome Brockmans while 
her husband Ronnie was in 
Hartford, Conn. attending an 
insurance school. They will 
spend this week in Canyon 
with her husband's parents, 
the Ross Russells. 

Virgie Gerber, Jim and 
Sandee Hoelting, Charley and 
Beverly Hill, Albert and Rita 
Hartman, Tricia and Glenda 
Gerber, Vicki Hunter, Larry 
Ramaekers, Mark Hoelting, 
Jerry Braddock, Danny Schil-
ling, Carroll, Keith, Danny 
and Rick Gerber went to 
Odessa Saturday for a house-
warming for Kevin and Har-
old Gerber's new mobile 
home. A number of friends 
were also there from Odessa. 
On Sunday we visited the 
Gene Gerbers and had dinner 
with Bill and Bernita Hoel-
ting. 

The Gene Gerber family, 
Kevin, Harold and Rick Ger- 

M. C. ADAMS, O.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 	364-2255 
Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Monday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:30 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 
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Brenda Durrett given 
Hall of Fame award 

Fifth Sunday Singing slated 

OUT OF TOWN 

STEREO 102 
KWAS-FM 

BACK ON THE AIR WITH 100,000 WATTS 

TUNE IN AND TELL YOUR FRIENDS 

TOTAL CHRISTIAN RADIO 

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Tarr of 
Dimmitt are the parents of a 
son who was born Jan. 12 in 
Deaf Smith General Hospital 
in Hereford. He was named 
Nicholas Jedadiah and weigh-
ed 7 pounds, 9 ounces. 

to give them the confidence 
they had shown on the basket-
ball court. In just three weeks 
of intensive practice they 
were able to forge their way 
to the title. 

Durrett left Nazareth for 
the job as pro in Amarillo, 
where she said work with the 
young players was her main 
incentive. 

She called her selection to 
the PSHOF "By far the most 
outstanding achievement I've 
ever made. Some of the peo-
ple I've admired the most 
have won this award and it 
makes me feel good to be 
recognized up there with 
them," she added as she 
mentioned her former coach, 
Barney Bevers, and David 
Kent. 

TO SAVE money and en-
ergy in the kitchen unplug the 
coffee maker and use kitchen 
fans only when needed. 

Brenda Durrett, who coach-
ed the girls doubles team at 
Nazareth to a state Class B 
tennis championship last year 
before she became a tennis 
pro at the Amarillo Town 
Club, was honored as the 
Panhandle Sports Hall of 
Fame Coach of the Year Sun-
day afternoon. 

Hall of Fame ceremonies 
were held in the Amarillo 
College men's gym, with 
awards made to top coaches 
and players in each major 
sport. 

Miss Durrett became the 
second in her family to be cit-
ed. Her sister Rita won the 
player award in 1958 when 
she took the state Class B 
singles crown for girls. Bren-
da won the same title in 1969-
70 as a player at Lakeview 
High School. 

At Nazareth last year she 
prepared Rachelle Pohlmeier 
and Rosemary Schulte for the 
state tennis meet after the 
close of the basketball season 
where both were starters on 
the state Class B Champion 
Swiftettes. 

Outside her school duties, 
Durrett also helped Sonja 
Hutcherson of Memphis in 
her singles game that won her 
the state Class A crown. 

The Nazareth doubles team 
had gone to the state tour-
nament as sophomores but 
lost there, and Durrett says 
her chief task with them was 

Save money on our mistake! 
Caobul Caudy 

Cauxbui Clui Kayo 
The board members of the 

Castro County Country Club 
met last week and decided 
that the club will be closed on 
Mondays, effective immed-
iately. 

There will be a Valentine 
Party Feb. 11 at the country 
club for members and their 
guests. The time will be 
posted later. It should be a lot 
of fun and we hope you will 
all come out and have a good 
time. 

Ladies, it's time to get your 
golf clubs out and clean them 
up and shine your shoes. Our 
ladies' days will be starting 
soon. We hope to have a great 
summer and lots of lady 
golfers. 

ROCKY RAWLS sinks a corner shot for 
Dimmitt in Friday night's wacky district game 
at Littlefield. Rawls finished as the game's 
high scorer with 14 points as the Bobcats 
won, 48-29. Littlefield came out in a stall from Photography by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

WEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS, TEXAS 

Box 484 	Phone 684-2535 

Nazareth  

Malibu Classic 4-Door Sedan 

Has body side moldings, rear window defogger, power brakes, power steering, 
automatic transmission, V8 engine, steel-belted radial WVV tires, push-button 
radio, Red metallic with knit cloth trim. 

Sisters host dinner "TWO heads are better 
than one." Not if both are 
stupid. The only place where 
two heads are better than one 
is a Ringling Brothers side-
show. 

By VIRGIE GERBER 

The Nazareth Sisters hosted 
a dinner Sunday for the area 
nuns from Amarillo, Canyon 
and Lubbock in celebration of 
99 years of the Benedictine 
Convent in Fort Smith, Ark. 

On Tuesday evening the 
Gale Adams and Randy 
Smiths visited the Lavern Wil-
helms and saw their new 
home. 

On Sunday Father Stanley 
and his housekeeper, Mrs. 
Pauline Ivey, had dinner with 
the Lavern Wilhelms. He also 
blessed their new home and 
consecrated the family to the 
Sacred Heart. 282 friends and 
relatives came to their open 
house Sunday afternoon, from 
Amarillo, Canyon, Dimmitt, 
Friona, Groom, Happy, Here- 

Dance To The Music Of 

L.B. & COMPANY 
Fri., Jan. 27 — 8 to 12 p.m. 

SOc per person 
(410-w9-K-000*-42"4014.49-0•40.60-.4".01,60.1.-0-0.40%.01441,1.40NuiT 

Sat., Jan. 28 — 9 p.m. to 1 a.m. 

$2" per person 

CANDLELIGHT SUPPER CLUB 
I." 

the start, and kicked off the third quarter by 
holding the ball more than two minutes 
without passing it, while the Bobcats stayed 
back in their 2-3 zone defense. 

[Photo by Steve Wheat] 

ber were home for 	funeral 
of Ray Berber of Umbarger. 

On Friday evening we cele-
brated Gene and Suzie Ger-
ber's teeth wedding anniver-
sary with a party at the home 
of Floyd and Dorothy Schulte. 

On Sunday the 15th Darrell, 
Kathy and Renee Podzemny 
of Amarillo had dinner at the 
Lavern ,Wilhelms. 

Mr. and Mrs. Nub Brock-
man of Lawrence, Neb. spent 
several days here visiting with 
Brockman relatives. 

Dimmitt Safety Lane Wants You To... cno 

the 

ANAPAYWAMANWAWIVWWWVAMANYVVWW 

194-385 Intersectio 
AmAdwww.wm.wirAmNywr 

REEVE-FLEMING CHEVROLET 

$100 BELOW 
DEALER INVOICE COST! 

This car was shipped from the factory 

without an air conditioner . . . . 

Fifth Sunday Singing will 
be held from 2 to 4 p.m. Sun-
day at the Lee Street Baptist 
Church, with the public in-
vited to come and join in fav-
orite gospel songs and famil-
iar hymns. 

The singing is a regular ac-
tivity held in the church and 
features audience participa-
tion in the songs rather than 
special numbers. Everyone 
who enjoys the old-time music 
is urged to be present. 

647-3111 

built to 
save LZNERGY 

FFICIENT 
HOME 

ENERGY 
FFICIENT 

HOME HE MICHELIN 
AT DIMMITT SAFETY LANE WE BELIEVE 

MIC 
IN 

AMERICANS HAVE A RIGHT TO POWERFUL 
ROAHRIP, A SMOOTH RADIAL RIDE, FUEL 
ECONOMY & LONG TREAD MILEAGE! 

FOR 
ALL 

MAKE 
TIRES AND MICHELIN X IS PRICED RIGHT! 

CONSERVING DOESN'T MEAN 
HAVING TO DO WITHOUT 

There is a new concept in home construction that provides the 

utmost comfort and convenience yet saves-Saves-Saves 

on heating and cooling. The Energy Efficient Home . . . a Total 

Electric concept in home building that is as modern as tomor-

row — it can save forty percent or more on heating and cooling 

costs when compared to previously accepted standards for 

Total Electric construction. AND YOU KNOW WHAT? YOU'LL 

BE FAR MORE COMFORTABLE TOO. GIVE US A CALL. 

LET US BE YOUR SAFETY MERCHANTS 
FOR THE UPCOMING HOLIDAYS.......... 
See Us For Free Estimates When You Need: Check Ups On Your... 

Brakes, Front End And Wheel Alignments, Shock Absorbers, Wheel 

Balancing, U Joints, Tie Rods, Ball Joints, Mufflers, Tires And Tire Rotation. SPS 
SOUTHWESTERN PUSLIC SERVICE 

OUR GENERATION IS FOR YOU ! 206 SE 2nd 	 Phone 647-4549 
	0.11  	vinamoremor 	  

LI?IMMITT SAFETY LANE 



[Continued from Page 1] 
favor of calling in an outside 
investigator. Asked whether a 
Grand Jury could conduct then 
investigation, County-District 
Attorney Jimmy Davis said 
the Grand Jury members had 
the right to decide for them-
selves whether to take on 
such e. probe, since no charg-
es had been filed. 

After voting to expel all law 
enforcement officers and their 
wives from the meeting, the 
crowd debated for an hour on 
the different types of inves-
tigative bodies that might be 
formed. 

Questions were also raised 
during the meeting on the 
possibility of a recall action, 
separation of city and county 

NAZARETH 
DITCHING 
SERVICE 

Underground Irrigation 
and Pipe Repair 

KELVIN KLEMAN 
945-2550 Days 
945-2535 Nights 945-2228 

LARGE 111 1 X1 4"  COLOR 
DECORATOR 

PORTRAIT 

t 
I " 

05 PLUS 50' 

ONLY *v 	HANDLING 

TOTS & TEENS 
101 E. Bedford 

SATURDAY ONLY 	JA4UARY-28 

10:00 5:00 

All Ages: Babies, Children And Adults. One Sitting Per Subject. 

Limit One Special Per Family. Special Pricing For Groups. 

Grand Jury 
indicts 7 

Castro County's current 
Grand Jury handed down sev-
en indictments and one no-bill 
from its Tuesday session. 

Bobby Lee Robinson of 
Dimmitt was indicted on ag-

gravated robbery charges for 
the alleged knife-point rob-
bery of Albert C. Ramirez. 

Leon Hodge of Littlefield 
was indicted on charges of tin-
authorized use of a vehicle in 
connection with a Dec. 21 
incident at Stan Byrnes Ford 
in Dimmitt 

Five were indicted for driv-
ing while intoxicated, subse-
quent offense: Javier Condar-
co, 46, of Hereford; Fernando 
Aguilar Garcia, 43, of Black; 
Raymundo Flores, 26, of 
Hart; George L. Lopez, 43, of 
Dimmitt; and Larry Paul Pool, 
34, of Plainview. 

R. L. Baker of Dimmitt was 
no-billed on charges of ag-
gravated assault. 

Snow and ice 
make problems 

More than two inches of 
snow and icy streets caused 
problems for both motorists 
and firemen Tuesday and 
Wednesday in the county. 

Four minor traffic mishaps 
occurred in the city of Dim-
mitt Tuesday, three of which 
were contributed to by the 
slick road conditions, accord-
ing to acting Police Chief San-
tos Perez. 

Two wrecks also were re-
ported to have happened out 
in the county, but no details 
were available at press time. 

A fire late Tuesday night at 
the Dennis Huseman farm 
one mile south and one-hall 
mile west of Nazareth re-
sulted in a well house-tool 
shed being completely burned. 

Assistant fire marshal 
Charles Littlejohn said the 
rescue unit and countt unit 
had some difficulty getting to 
the fire because of the road 
conditions and slowed travel. 

"By the time we got there 
it was already burnt down," 
Littlejohn said. "The Naza-
reth fire department got there 
first, but it was still too late." 

No injuries were reported in 

connection with the fire and 
no damage estimate was giv-
en. The exact cause of the fire 
has not been determined, but 
Littlejohn said he thought 
there may have been some 
type of heating device in the 
well house that started the 
blaze. 

LIVESTOCK feeders, farm-
ers and agribusinessmen who 
want to acquaint themselves 
with the facts about methane 
generation from livestock ma-
nure are invited to a special 
seminar on that subject Feb. 
15 at the Sewart County Com-
munity College in Liberal, 
Kans. 

Keith Lemons 

Lemons files 
as candidate 

Keith Lemons, a lifelong 
resident of Castro County, has 
filed for election to the office 
of county-district attorney in 
Castro County, subject to the 
May Democratic primary. 

Lemons, a graduate of Hart 
High School and Baylor Un-
iversity, has had several 
months experience as an as-
sistant to a Plainview attor-
ney. Lemons has recently 
taught a course in street law 
to adults in the Waco Schools. 
He will complete an intern-
ship with the district attorney 
in McLennan County this 
spring. 

"I am eager to getil home 
and would sincerely apprec-
iate the opportunity of serving 
the people of Castro County 
as county attorney," Lemons 
said. 	Advertisement 

GROUND FLOOR OPPORTUNITY! 
Talk To Our New Lubbock County 

Health Sciences Center Hospital 

Recruiting Team 

For RN's and LVN's 

In AMARILLO 

FRIDAY, JAN. 27, 10:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 
HILTON INN, GOVERNOR'S PARLOR 

7909 1-40 (East) 
We will make commitments and hire on the spot. 
Full and part time at all levels 
Competitive pay and benefits.  
Most positions require some weekend and evening 
hours. 

Come Grow With Us: 
PERSONNEL DEP'T. 
HEALTH SCIENCES CENTER HOSPITAL 
602 INDIANA 
LUBBOCK, TEXAS 79417 

Equal Opportunity Employer 

PAXTON Tire &Service 
SE 3rd on 385 Hwy. South 
	

Pit Stop - On Farm Tire Service 

NO HASSLE 

AUTO 

SERVI • 

These Services FREE With The Purchase Of A Set Of Tires: 

J/ FREE Mounting 	t/ FREE Balancing 	v' FREE Chassis Lube 
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$2488  Ackbt•onil 
Darts extra 
if needed. 

• Drain and replace transmis-
sion fluid • Replace transmis-
sion litter, when equipped • 
install new pan gasket • Adjust 
linkage and bands, where ap-
plicable. 

Up To 5 Quarts Major Brand 
10/30 Grade Oil 

LOBE & OIL CHANGE 
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• Complete chassis lubrica- 
tion and oil change • Helps 
protect parts-ensures 
smooth, quiet performance 
• Includes light trucks • 
Please phone for appoint-
ment. 

$ 88 

647.4121 

Additionalnted  
parts exits 

ton ow ci 
 

2-albeel front Disc Install new front 
disc pads • Resurface and true ro• 
tors • Repack front wheel bearings 
and instaii new grease seats • In. 
sped AdIdtailluidlerSarirdroad ncrIterasutliccatsys,  tem 

CI 
4-111beel Onnn• install nest linings 
ail 4 wneels • Roue brake drums 
• Repack front wheel bearings and 
-stall new grease seals • Check 
hydraulic system • Add Auld and 
road test car 

YEAR I  GoODfr 
For more good years in your car 

13 8 Parts extra 
d rxeded 

Nost U.S. save foreign 
cars fdeDeDdin Oa make) 

IMPROVES TIRE MILEAGE, 
HANDUNG, AND CONTROL 
• Inspect and rotate all 4 Wel 
• Adjust caster, camber, & 
toe-in to manufacturers spec-
ifications • Inspect steering 
and suspension components 
• Road test car • Excludes 
front-wheel drive cars, 

Ill 

$36§§:: 
gM 

Price Meteors pads and labor 
S4 less for electrum ignition 

SAVES GAS, GIVES FAST 
STARTS IN ANY WEATHER 
• Electronic engine, starting. and 
charging system analyse • Install 
new Mints. plugs, condenser • Set 
dwell and lime engine to saecihca-
tows • edpast carburetor for fuel 
economy • Cars with air condition-
int 52 more • Includes Datsue, 
YW. Toyota, and light trucks. 

88 

4- 
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More abootti 

SO-PD probe demanded ... 

Nazareth girls 
top Silverton 

The Nazareth varsity girls 
basketball team came out of 
its first district game with a 
47-43 victory over Silverton, 
their toughest district foe, on 
Silverton's home court. 

Cheryl Hartman led the 
scoring with 22 points, fol-
lowed by Karen Schulte with 
15. 

"Doretta Ramaekers sank 
two crucial shots in the fourth 
quarter when Cheryl was cov-
ered up," Coach George Cox 
said. "Glenda Gerber was 
also in the scoring with six 
points. " 

Cox praised guards Colleen 
Gerber ("super on the 
boards"), Germaine Pohlme-
ier ("returned to play after a 
foot injury in the third quar-
ter") and Lenore Braddock 
1"excellent play despite her 
recent illness"). 

"The rivalry was intense 
and there were emotional 
memories (last year Coach 
Cathy Wilson's father died in 
the Silverton gym)," Cox 
said, "but I think the girls 
held up under the pressure 
and tension very well." 

Friona supper set 
Friday the Friona Chieftain 

Parents will host their annual 
chili-stew and homemade pie 
supper from 4-8:30 during the 
Dimmitt-Friona game there. 

Prices for the meal are $2 
for adults and $1.25 for child-
ren under 12. Everyone is 
invited. 
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facilities and abolishment of 
the police department in favor 
of a city-county law enforce-
ment agency. 

Also, Marvin presented a 
list of 10 questions "to pro-
vide a departure point for an 
investigation," involving city-
county agreements on shared 
facilities, "backup" support 
among the various law en-
forcement agencies, use of 
prisoners, and the competen-
cy and conduct of local law 
officers. 

Finally, the group adopted 
a motion by Mrs. Tina Raw-
lings that the city commission 
and county commissioners' 
court serve as a joint com-
mittee to investigate the prob-
lem, and that if they can't 
solve it, to call in a profes-
sional investigator. 

The crowd also adopted a 
motion by Jack Edwards to 
add Don Nelson and Marvin 
to the investigation committee 
"so they could report back to 
the public on the committee's 
progress and on questions 
being raised." 

The joint fact-finding com-
mittee held its first meeting 
Monday, and is to start in-
terviewing individual lawmen 
later this week. 

Local woman's 
mother dies 

Mrs. Marguerite Elizabeth 
"Sal" Murdock Smith of 
Memphis, mother of Mrs. 
Wade Maynard of Dimmitt, 
died Monday. 

Funeral services were to be 
held Wednesday in the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Memphis with the Rev. Ken-
neth Metzger, pastor, offic-
iating. Burial was to follow in 
Fairview Cemetery by Spicer 
Funeral Home. 

A native of McGregor, Mrs. 
Smith, 66, moved to Hall 
County with her parents in 
1914. Dec. 23, 1929 she mar-
ried John W. Smith at Clar-
endon. She was a member of 
the Rebekah Lodge and the 
First United Methodist 
Church and its Victory Sunday 
School class. 

Survivors other than Mrs. 
Maynard, include her hus-
band; three brothers, Frank 
Murdock of Muleshoe, John 
Murdock of Amarillo and Rob-
ert Murdock of Littlefield; and 
a grandson. 

HOSPITAL NEW$ 
PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL: 

Fidel Barrera 
Amy Boothe 
Brenda Buchanan 
Celia Carlile 
Don Carpenter 
Wayne Grant 
Elvah Hughes 
Mary Huseman 
Janet Hutcheson 
Jessie Hutcheson 
Donna Johnson 
Carolyn McDonald 
Alice Martinez 
Eric Mays 
Carol Sanders 
Georgia Sifuentez 
Kim Weatherford 
Mary Lou Webb 

PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
Inez Crump 
Noramee Newsom 
Ruth Payne 
Joseph Stubblefield III 
Don Elliott 
Mae Cox 
J. A. Coughran 
N. W. Anderson 
Reyna Flores 
Cleo Castaneda 
Oma Bulls 
P. P. Robb 
Judith Graham 
Tina Gonzalez 
J. W. Hawthorne 
Robbie McLean 
Dorothy Walker 
Shirley Barnes 
Angela Martinez 
Richard McGuire 
Pam Nutt 
Choc Lay 
Merry Martinez 
Robert Huseman 
Loyd Vaughan 
Sid Bullock 
Dorothy Musick 
Rosalina Anes 

DIMMITT 
JV girls 12, Littlefield 25 
JV boys 48, Littlefield 28 

(Steve Maples 20) 
Varsity girls 69, Littlefield 55 

(Norma Sandoval 29) 
Varsity boys 48, Littlefield 29 

(Rocky Rawls 14) 
Tulia Tournament 

7th B girls 35, Canyon Pur. 12 
(Melodie Edwards 18) 

7th B girls 36, Tulia 24 
(Edwards 23) 
(won tourney) 

7th B boys 43, Canyon Pur. 15 
(Lonnie Robb 15) 

7th B boys 34, Tulia 10 
(Robb, Johnny Gonzales 
and Doug Schilling 9) 
(won tourney) 

7th boys 50, Friona 22 
(Watts 13, Cleveland 11) 
(District record: 7-1) 

8th boys 43, Friona 25 
Moreno 12, Enriquez 10) 
(District record: 7-1) 

9th boys 50, Friona 42 
(Mike Oldham 23) 

7th girls 8, Friona 14 
(DeAnn Hanson 4) 
(District record: 2-6) 

8th girls 8, Friona 26 
(Sonya Andrews 4) 
(District record: 7-1) 

9th girls 40, Friona 29 
(Andrews 12, Salinas 11) 

HART 
7th girls 22, Nazareth 20 

(Linda Washington 14) 
7th & 8th boys 32, Nazareth 

27 
(D. Rich, A. Carrasco and R. 

Basketball scores 
Martinez 6) 

8th girls 21, Nazareth 44 
(Suzahn Rowland 7) 

JV boys 33, Springlake 44 
(Scott Jones 11) 

Varsity girls 42, S-E 55 
(Averitt 16, Upshaw 15) 

Varsity boys 72, S-E 51 
(Johnny Newsom 24) 

7th girls 20, Bovina 19 
(Washington 12) 

(won in 2nd overtime) 
7th boys 24, Bovina 26 

(C. Myrick, Carrasco and L. 
Washington 6) 

(overtime) 
8th girls 15, Bovina 27 

(Eloisa Guzman 11) 
8th boys 37, Bovina 23 

(Rich 13, Barretero 8) 
JV boys 56, Kress 55 

(Benny McLain 14) 
(won in third overtime) 

Varsity girls 50, Kress 51 
(Melanie Upshaw 29) 

Varsity boys 57, Kress 68 
(Glen Black 20) 

If you are thinking of buying 
Storm Windows 

DON'T 
buy until you have seen our New 

THERMO SHIELD 
Window Insulating System! 

The Insulating Window that installs inside your 
present window at approximately 1/2  the cost 

of outside aluminum storm windows. 
Custom Designed - Custom Built 

Here in Dimmitt For Free Estimate Call Ray Byrnes 

21ST CENTURY CONST. CO. 
647.5696 
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NAZARETH 
7th girls 20, Hart 22 

(Rhonda Hoelting 10) 
7th & 8th boys 27, Hart 32 

(Calvin Schulte 15) 
8th girls 44, Hart 21 

(Liz Wilhelm 14) 
7th & 8th girls 39, Silverton 6 

(Roxanne Birkenfeld) 
7th & 8th boys 26, Silverton40 

(Calvin Schulte 13) 
JV boys 38, Silverton 55 

(Book 9, P. Hartman 8) 
Varsity girls 47, Silverton 43 

(Cheryl Hartman 22) 
(District record: 1-0) 

Varsity boys 31, Silverton 46 
(D. Huseman, B. Huseman 
and Jeff Schmucker 8) 

The Dimmitt Middle School 
7th B Boys' and 7th B Girls' 
basketball teams made a 
clean sweep at the Tulia 
Seventh Grade Tournament 
Saturday, with both taking 
championship honors. 

In the first boys' game 
Dimmitt defeated Canyon 
Purple 43-15, with Lonnie 
Robb as high scorer with 15 
points. John Collins and John-
ny Gonzales were cited by 
Coach Shott Miller as "turn-
ing in good games." 

In the finals of the one-day 
tournament, Dimmitt boys de-
feated Tulia 34-10. Robb, 

Seventh graders win tourney 

HISTORICAL sites abound 
in and around Nacogdoches, 
one of the oldest cities in 
Texas, and San Augustine, an 
early gateway to the state. 

Gonzales and Doug Schilling 
led the scoring with nine 
points each. Miller also prais-
ed the play of Troy Ellison 
and Steve Martinez. 

In the girls' half of the ac-
tion, Dimmitt defeated Can-
yon Purple 35-12, led by Mel-
odie Edwards with 18 points. 

Edwards led with 23 points 
in the final game when Dim-
mitt downed Tulia 36-24. 
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1974 Chevrolet Impala 4-Dr. Sedan 
V8 engine, automatic transmission, power steering, power brakes, air 
conditioning, radio, heater, and MORE. Come see—come save! 

$1495 
REEVE-FLEMING CHEVROLET 
194-385 Intersection 

eredvememeretromor 

647.3111 

 

offers 

L..  (Offer Expires Feb. 28) 

on 
Quality, Award-Winning Portraits 

Specialzing In: 
✓ Nome and Environmental Portraits 

1,  Wedding and Anniversary Candids 

✓ Group & Team Photos 

w,  School Photography, Proms, etc. 

;/ Commercial, Industrial Photos 

CALL or COME BY THE STUDIO 
at 715 MAIN, FRIONA 
	 247-3419 or 

247-2116 

SPECIAL DISCOUNT COUPON I  
TO DIMMITT AREA RESIDENTS 

X10% - 2S%OFF I  

Crozier is new prexy 
for Dimmitt Kiwanis 

Bob Crozier has been nam-
ed to fill the unexpired term 
of Kiwanis Club President 
Mark Cleavinger, who resign-
ed because he is moving to 
Amarillo. 

First Vice-president Lee 
Roy Wood is also moving, so 
the top position fell to Second 
Vice-president Crozier. 

Former nominating commit-
tee members Joe Nelson, Jack 
Patton, Bill Thornton and 
Richard Stahl will name two 
members to fill the two vice- 

Now leasing 

WEST TEXAS 
MINI-STORAGE 

lock it & leave it 

647-3427 or 
296-6372 

presidencies by the next club 
meeting. 

"We want to remind all 
board members to be at the 
board meeting Monday mor-
ning at 6:30 a.m.," Crozier 
told the members at the club 
meeting Monday. 

Randall Craig reported on 
the progress of the forming of 
a Kiwanettes Club, which was 
to have had an organizational 
meeting Wednesday evening. 
Kiwanians from Tulia were to 
present the group with a new 
club packet. 

Club members were re-
minded of an upcoming bowl-
ing tournament Feb. 18 in 
Amarillo, with the team entry 
deadline set for Tuesday. 

Members were also remind-
ed of a raise in dues up to $15 
per month to cover a rise in 
the price of the meals. 

The 18 members and club 
sweetheart present were join-
ed by three guests, including 
Key Clubbers Jeff Lindsey 
and Kelly Hill. 

MENS DRESS PANTS 
Reg. 25' Now Only 1667  
Reg. 24" Now Only 16°° 
Reg. 22" Now Only 15°' 
Reg. 20' Now Only 1334 

Reg. 18°° Now Only 12°° 
Reg. 17" Now Only 1134 

Reg. 16°° Now Only 10" 
Reg. 12' Now Only 8" 

This Is It! 
Entire Stock Ladies 

COATS 
• Short • Long 

Tremendious Savings!! 

Infant & Girls 

COATS 1/2  PRICE 

MR. AND MRS. LELAND SMITH 
. . Celebrate Golden Wedding 

Anniversary marked 
Mr and Mrs. Leland Smith 

celebrated their Golden Wed-
ding anniversary Saturday af-
ternoon in their home with a 
gathering of their immediate 
family. 

The Smiths have four child-
ren, Elbert and Wesley of 
Dimmitt, Elzada Funck of 
Houston and Zell Wilson of 
Richardson, and 10 grand-
children. 

The actual date of their 
wedding anniversary falls 
Wednesday. Zelma Dunn and 
Leland Smith were married 
Jan. 25, 1928, in Hereford. 
They have lived in Castro 
County since the marriage. 

Smith has been a lifelong 
resident of Castro County. 
Mrs. Smith was born in Col-
orado and moved to Hereford 
with her family as a girl. 

Mother's rites held Monday 
Mrs. Hattie Mae Campbell 

of Littlefield, mother of Bar-
ney Campbell of Hart, died 
Saturday at Plainview. Fun-
eral services were held Mon-
day in the First United Meth-
odist Church at Littlefield and 
burial in Memorial Park Cem-
etery there. 

A Littlefield resident since 
1944, Mrs. Campbell was a 
native of C&.manche County. 

In addition to the son here,  

she is survived by another 
son, Elmo of Lubbock; three 
daughters, Sue Hemphill of 
Hobbs, N.M., Louise Cran-
ford of Midland and LaRue 
Johnson of Sapulpa, Okla.; 
two sisters, 11 grandchildren, 
19 great-grandchildren and 
one great-great-grandchild. 

"TRUTH is stranger than 
fiction:" Of course it is: Fic-
tion has to make sense. 

PREPARED CHILDBIRTH 
6 Weeks of Lamaze Classes 

Contact Jill Moudy, Certified 

Lamaze Instructor 
764-3470 

	 RICK 
LUTHER 

Studio of Photography 

Thursday, January 26, 1978 
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SO-PD probe committee imaels Id".  

works out ground rules Pre
.view of 

spring styles The committee elected Fri-  Wilson and Anna Margaret 
day to investigate alleged Moss, City Commissioners 
problems between the Dim- Chet Braafladt and J. R. 
mitt Police Dept. and the Brown, Jerry Marvin of 
County Sheriff's Office went KDHN Radio and Don Nelson 
into closed session at its first of the Castro County News. 
meeting Monday, over the ob- 	After a 90-minute session, 
jections of Sheriff Granville the committee released this 
Martin's attorney and a vis-  statement: 
iting TV newsman. 	 "The Citizens' Committee 

the committee had no auth-
ority, and that since its mem-
bers included the city and 
county governing boards plus 
two newsmen, its meeting 
amounted to a joint city-
county executive session clos-
ed to all but the two news-
men. 

The objectors argued that appointed by concerned cit- 
izens in its first meeting 

rules for conducting its study 

officers as a group to explain 

Monday. established ground 

and called in all available law 

to them what the committee 
wanted to accomplish. 

spokesman for the committee, 
explained to the lawmen that 

"Jerry Marvin, serving as 

Committee members are the committee would be call-
County Judge Weldon Brad-  ing them individually at a 
ley, Mayor Elmer Youts, future meeting and that their 
County Commissioners Ed cooperation would be apprec-
Bennett, Jerry Wilhelm, Edd iated." 

*********************************** 
* * 
* Now Open—  *  
* * * * 

PATTERSON 
* 
* * ENGINE 4! 	 . 
* * 	 * 

SERVICE  * 4, * * * * 405 S. Broadway it  *  it 	 * 
Specializing in 	 4( * 

* *  
* 4, 
* it 
* * Farm Engine Repair 	* 
* 'It  
* 	 * 
41 lc 
• * Irrigation Engine Repair 
* * * * 
41 • * Tractor Repair  
* * * * 
* * 
* 	 David Patterson 	* 
11 	 '1 

g 11 

* Phone 647-3645 
* * * * 
O 16-2tp 	 it 
*********************************** 

BIGGER VALUES • PRICES SLASHED! 

MENS DRESS SHOES 	20% OFF 
Entire Stock Mens & Boys 

• SWEATERS 
• JACKETS • COATS 

1/3  OFF The Reg. Price 

Mens & Boys 

KNIT SHIRTS 	14 OFF  

Mens 2 & 3 Piece 

DRESS SUITS 20% OFF 
Mens Dress Western 

FELT HATS 20%.OFF  
Mens Perma Press H-Bar C 

WESTERN SHIRTS1/3  OFF 

Entire Stock Mens, Ladies & Boys 

COWBOY BOOTS 20% OFF 
• Tony Lama • Cowtown • Justin • Texas Brand • Wrangler 

JUNIOR TOPS 
Buy 1 Regular Price Receive Another FREE 

LADIES FALL SHOES 	3 OFF 
One Big Selection 

CENTER STAGE 
SPORTSWEAR 

• JACKETS • BLOUSES 
• PANTS • BLAZERS 

• SWEATERS • SKIRTS 

Big1  OFF  Savings!  / 3  
Reduced To Clear 

LADIES PANTS 5500  to $788  

Used Car of the Month: 

LADIES WESTERN SUITS 
• TOPS • BLOUSES • PANTS 

	
1/2  OFF 

Big Selection Playtex 

BRAS & GIRDLES 
	

1/2  OFF  
FALL HANDBAGS 
	

OFF  
Girls 

• TOPS • SWEATERS & • PANTS 1/2  OFF 

HARMAN'S 
PHU/1U CLEARANCE By IRENE KEATING 

As the cold winds blow and 
the snow falls, our thoughts 
turn to warm spring days and 
new clothes. For those of you 
who like to look like "ladies," 
you'll enjoy the styles this 
spring. 

Fabrics are light, airy and 
soft, with subtle textures—
with the natural fibers being 
the most popular. Old fash-
ioned looks in challis in floral 
prints and paisleys, and fem-
inine looks in eyelet and lace; 
soft looks in gauze, linen or 
silky knits. Feminine looks 
appear in lace, eyelet, hand 
crochet and embroidered 
fashions. 

Textures are nubby, stubs, 
hopsacking, chenille, pique, 
seersucker and tweed. There 
will be stripe, plaid, floral, 
chintz and jacquard designs. 

Colors are natural—white 
on white, neutrals and tans 
and pale pastels. 

Design details feature 
drawstrings, dolman, loose or 
puffed sleeves; fluttery neck-
lines, ruffles, pleating, tucks, 
pierrot or shawl collars. 

Pant legs will be slimmmer 
more sundresses, peasant 
dresses, loose blazers, frilly 
blouses. circular, full, tiered 
or pleated skirts will be worn. 

Accessories include crystal 
drop jewelry, ceramic ban-
gles, embroidered handker-
chiefs, flowers at the neck, 
waist and in the hair. You'll 
also see lower heeled sandals 
and moccasins. 

Hopefully you'll like at least 
some of these new trends in 
fashion. However, remember 
to wear what fits your per-
sonality, looks good on you 
and lets you feel comfortable. 

What's cooking 
at the schools 

Here are the school lunch 
menus for Dimmitt schools for 
Jan. 30-Feb. 3. 

MONDAY — Chicken fried 
steak, gravy, creamed pota-
toes, green beans, fruit, rolls, 
butter, milk. 

TUESDAY — Beef stew, 
cornbread, crackers, pineap-
ple slice, cinnamon rolls, 
milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Chili dog, 
cabbage salad, pork and 
beans, apple crisp, milk. 

THURSDAY — Spaghetti 
and ground beef, blackeyed 
peas, spinach, temptation 
dessert, rolls, butter, milk. 

FRIDAY — Burritos, tossed 
salad, corn, gelatin, milk. 

Singing postponed 
The appearance of Mike 

and Sheila Newman that had 
been set for Wednesday night 
at the First Christian Church 
of Dimmitt has been postpon-
ed until Feb. 1. 

According to the church's 
minister, Roy Barringer, New-
man came down with the flu, 
causing the delay. 

The public is invited to hear 
the couple sing and share 
their testimonies at 7:30 p.m. 
Feb. 1. Refreshments will 
follow in the fellowship hall. 

647-3123 For Printing 



11111- Is 

HAVOLINE 

MOTOR 

1I 	Ii11.ill 	 
HAVOLINE 

MOTOR OIL 

Air 
	. 	Air 

	

„mum 	 

OIL 
Limit 12 Cans 
Reg. 65` Now 

2/$1 	 

5 lb. Bag 

WILD BIRD 

FOODS 

88` 

VISA' ter chage 

11111111111111111 

I 	c 
pkg. 

1E1 MN MIN 

I 

• • • 

112 S. Bdwy. 	 Dimmitt, Texas 	 Phone 6474440 
Store Hours: Mon..Fri. 8:30 a.m. to 8 p.m. 	 Sat. 8:30 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD THRU SATURDAY, JANUARY 28, 1978 

VEGETABLE & 

FLOWER SEEDS 

With Sprinkler Spout 

	

I 	SELF WATERING 

	

2 $11 781 	TRAYS Gallon 	
28.3" 

Pots In Tray $ 	78 1  

	

1 	ROSE MILK 
I SKIN CARE CREAM 

Nimme 

TG&Y 

OIL 

FILTERS 

Reg. $1L7 Now 

$ 1 27 

Reg. 51' A 3C rim Now 

lit 	SUPER CUBE 

ICE CUBE TRAYS 

le", DRIP CUP 
llllllllll 

W COFFEE ASSORTED HAIR BRUSHES 

FILTERS 	 2/$11 

INSULATED 

DRINKING CUPS 
51 Count 	9 oz. 

Trial Size 

100 Count 

NOW 

2/$1  TG&Y SPRAY 

1 
r. 

4/$1 

3/$1 

DOUBLE KNITS tr4 
58/60" Wide $ 38 

C----->Care table No. 3 
• / 	Reg. '1" yd. 	1 	yd. 

100% Cotton 

Hi Dri or Scottowels 

PAPER 

TOWELS 
2 Ply 

Reg. 67' 
Now 

ADYE.TISEO MOICHANOISE POLICY 

co oanis oorg 

pann~tpp m.  
G &I 	piovi • 

{I/ 
Cpxl upon repuetl. in 	or Mat IN merelundi 

M:tr, 

Ell 	IMI Ili MN MI ME 

PANTY HOSE 

Reg. $1" 
Now 

ENAMEL 
SPRAY 

6-114 

78c  
LIQUID PLUMR 

sac 

52 

ENAMEL 

32 fl. oz. 
Reg. $109 Now 

Reg. 67` Now 

y.::*P ppy 

13 13 oz. 

One Size Fits All 

wlp ,„ 

ON 

Towels 

2/$1 

SHEATH LINNING 
44/45" Wide 

Care Lable No. 3 
Reg. '1" yd. 

SAVINGS 

41111 
COUNTRY GARDEN :—

PRINTS 
50% Polyester 50% Avril 	• 

$ 1 47 44/45" Wide 

Reg. '1" yd. 

100% Polyester 

111 
I TG&Y 
I SPONGE 

MOPS 

TG&Y 
LIGHT 

BULBS 
pkg. of 4 

Reg. 97` pkg. 
Now 

Reg. $249 Now 

99C 

Y • 

88` 

yd. 

jii j - 

I 	DUST PANS 	I 
I Plastic 	 I 

.1c1' 

I WATERING CAN I Assorted Polyester 

Golden Rose 

450 
TG&Y 

PERMANENT 
ANTI-FREEZE 

$277 

HERSHEY 
OR M&M 
CANDY 
BARS HERSHEYS1 

7/98c 

OSNABERG 
44/45" Wide 

Care Lable No. 1 
Reg. '1" yd. 

$ 37 

yd. 

ScoiTowels I 
I 

DE S 

illh 

age 14 
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