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For enlarged commission 

Youts to order election Monday 

The golf tournament spon-
sored by the Dimmitt United 
Way has been rescheduled for 
Oct. 13 at the Castro County 
Country Club. 

"The nine-hole tournament 
is open to everyone," said 
Gary Moore, UW chairman. 

"The UW has reached 46% 
of its $16,250 goal with 25% 
of the money from the home-
to-home canvass in," Moore 
reported. The total as of Wed-
nesday morning was $7,-
482.75. 

Volunteers are still needed 

for canvassing, Moore said. 
The streets that are in need of 
volunteers are SW 6th, NW 
6th and 11th and the east side 
of US 385. Anyone who will 
volunteer for these streets is 
urged to contact Moore at 
647-2101 during the day. 

Response to UW contribu-
tions is mixed, Moore said. 
"People are not giving their 
fair share," he added. 

The home-to-home canvass 
is being held this year rather 
than solicitation of employees 
through business firms as in 
the past. 

Beet crop prospects 
promise bumper yield 

The 1979 sugar beet crop in 
Castro County is "encourag-
ing, and we expect a bumper 
harvest" starting Oct. 9, ac-
cording to Calvin Jones, ag-
ricultural manager of the Hol-
ly Sugar Corp. Hereford 
plant. 

Beets that were defoliated 
by hard hailstorms of late 
summer have been sampled 
the past two weeks and show 
the sugar content holding at a 
high level, Jones said. Sugar 
content on the entire crop is 
up somewhat this year, he 
added. 

Growers were concerned 
that the hail-damaged plants 
would expend energy growing 
new leaves above ground, and 
so cut down on the sugar 
content of the beets, but this 
has not occurred to a great 
extent, Jones explained. Opti-
mum moisture in the soil pre-
vented growth from affecting 
sugar content. 

"The foliage has continued 
to grow due to timely rains 
and shows good recovery from 
the hail damage," he said. 
"At the same time the sugar 
content has not dropped dras-
tically. It was fortunate that 
the hail came about six weeks 
before harvest." 

be held, under state law, is 
Nov. 6, City Attorney Jack 
Edwards said. 

Youts has openly supported 
the aldermanic form of gov-
ernment, while Commission-
ers J. R. Brown and Chet 
Braafladt—who voted against 
the change last year—have 
said they aren't opposed to 
the different form of govern-
ment but are concerned 
whether enough candidates 
would be willing to serve on a 
five-man board of aldermen. 

Youts started pushing for a 
larger governing board in July 
after being outvoted on a pro-
posed raise in police salaries. 

Brown and Braafladt said 
they opposed the raise be-
cause it had already been dis-
cussed and excluded from the 
adopted city budget, and be-
cause it would not be ac-
companied by similar raises 
for other city employees. 

Petitions signed by 364 per-
zons have been turned in to 
Mayor Elmer Youth, calling 
for an election in November to 
change the present three-
man city commission to a six-
man governing board, with 
five aldermen and a mayor. 

Youth said the signatures 
must be certified by Monday, 
and asked that anyone else 
carrying petitions deliver 
them to him this week. The 
petitions began circulating the 
week of July 23. 

Petitions bearing the sig-
natures of 10% of the city's 
registered voters are required 
to call the election. City At-
torney Jack Edwards has said 
that 195 certified signatures 
would be required. 

Youts said he plans to order 
the election Monday, after 
certifying the legally required 
number of signatures. The 
earliest date the election may 

'59 and '54 classes 
of DHS set reunions 

Stations to receive the beets 
at Dimmitt and Hart will open 
Oct. 9, Jones announced, and 
digging is due to get un-
derway at 8 a.m. that day. 
Factory operations at the 
Hereford plant are to start 
Oct. 11. 

Operation will be on a day-
to-day basis during the re-
mainder of October, he said, 
and on Nov. 1 stockpiling of 
the beets will start and beets 
will be received on an open 
basis. 

Samples run recently on 
beets from fields not hit by 
the hail reflect about a half of 
one percent higher sugar con-
tent than those at this time 
last year, Jones said, and 
weights are up also. 

Price of sugar is unchanged 
from last year, the Holly ag-
ricultural manager said, and 
any change would be due to 
federal action. At present 
beets with 15 percent sugar 
content are bringing $26 per 
ton. 

Jones also announced that 
soil sampling for next year's 
crop has begun, and growers 
who want their soil checked 
for possible planting to beets 
are asked to noti his office 
to receWe listing o 	am- 
pie schedule. 

[in suit] and Texas Agriculture Commissioner Reagan Brown 
[behind Hance]. Bergland said during his whirlwind tour of 
crop damage in the area that he hopes the USDA can 
"formulate some programs that are tailor-made for individual 
areas and situations, such as exist here." 

"SEEING IS BELIEVING—the economic losses here are self-
evident," Secretary of Agriculture Bob Bergland [in vest] tells 
reporters while surveying the hail damage to Billy Smith's 
cotton crop in Lamb County Thursday. Helping Bergland field 
reporters' questions are Smith [left], Congressman Kent Ilance 

Bergland promises 'full support' 
After touring hailed-out farmers, but admitted last 

cropland 4inimaisiimaihaddia~bwevitiery-that he didn't really 
last Thursday, Secretary of expect to get it. 
Agriculture Bob Bergland 	"The Secretary told me that 

limited on how much money 
ttf#, 	 " 

New CofC manager 
is Delores Golden 

Among the 100 or more 
who accompanied Bergland 
on his inspection tour of South 
Plains cropland Thursday 
were County Judge M. L. 
Simpson Jr., County Commis-
sioner Anna Margaret Moss, 
Carl King, president of the 
Texas Corn Growers Associa-
tion and state Democratic ex-
ecutive committeeman, Texas 
Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan Brown, and a host of 
state and federal officials and 
reporters. 

Delores Golden will be the 
new Dimmitt Chamber of 
Commerce manager, and is 
already at the chamber office 
learning her duties, the Board 
of Directors has announced. 

Mrs. Golden will succeed 
Shirley Hall, who recently 
resigned and will leave the 
manager's job Oct. 1. 

"I am looking forward to 
working with the people of 
Dimmitt in the Chamber of 
Commerce," the new man-
ager said Monday. 

Mrs. Golden has lived in 
Dimmitt since early childhood 
and is a 1970 graduate of 
Dimmitt High School. She has 
been employed the past year 
in the accounting department 
of the Dimmitt Amstar Plant. 

A member of First Baptist 
Church, she is a Sunday 
School teacher and an active 
member of Baptist Young 
Women. She is a member and 

ber are expected for the re-
union. Two members of the 
class are deceased. 

Officers of the group were 
Morris Westberry, now of 
Canyon, president; Gordon 
Thanisch, Arlington, vice-
president; Sandra Leeth 
Michels, Houston, treasurer; 
Lynn Hendrix Langford, Am-
arillo, secretary; Jo Beecher, 
now living in Germany, re-
porter: James Rogers, Carrol-
ton, and Gary Wyatt, Pasa-
dena, Tex., business man-
agers. 

Avis and Ralph Smith were 
the class sponsors. 

The Class of 1954 will hold 
its reunion from 11 a.m. to 2 
p.m. Oct. 6, according to Car-
olyn Sides. Efforts are being 
made to contact all its mem-
bers. 

Any other class planning a 
reunion is asked to notify the 
high school office to aid in ar-
ranging Homecoming pro-
grams. The Castro County 
News will publicize announce-
ments for classes wishing to 
contact members if the an-
nouncement is brought or tel-
ephoned to the office. 

Class reunions for Dimmitt 
High School exes will be a 
part of the annual DHS 
Homecoming weekend Oct. 5 
and 6, with the graduates of 
1959 as the honored class this 
year. The Class of 1954 has 
also announced plans for its 
silver anniversary reunion. 

Activities for the 'S9ers will 
start at the pep rally Friday 
afternoon. Class members will 
sit together and be recognized 
on the program. A reception 
will follow the pep rally, in 
the DHS home economics de-
partment. 

After the Dimmitt-Tulia 
game that night, the class will 
hold a get-together in the 
home of Don and Carlee War-
ren. He is one of the '59 
grads. A noon luncheon at the 
Colonial Inn Saturday will 
conclude entertainment for 
graduates and their families. 

Arrangements are being 
made by Brenda Andrews, 
Patsy Roberts, Marilyn Ginn 
and Sandra Nelson. They re-
port that of the 43 who grad-
uated in the class, all but two 
have been located and a num- 

King also co-hosted a ban-
quet at noon Thursday hon-
oring Bergland, Hance and 
Congressman Charles Sten-
holm. A large delegation of 
Castro Countians was present 
at the luncheon in the Hilton 
Inn banquet hall. Hereford man announces 

past officer of Alpha Epsilon 
Tau Chapter, Beta Sigma Phi 
sorority. She has been active 
in working with the Heart As-
sociation and the American 
Cancer Society fund raising 
campaigns. 

As chamber manager she 
will be responsible for the op-
eration of the Chamber of 
Commerce office, communi-
cating with the chamber 
membership and working with 
various projects and activities. 

Mrs. Golden lives with her 
three children at 901 West 
Bedford. 

"We appreciate the out-
standing work of Shirley Hall 
in the Chamber Office and we 
wish her success in her future 
endeavors," Chamber Presi-
dent Jerry Marvin said. 

"We feel fortunate to have 
Delores joining us in our work 
for a bigger and better Dim-
mitt." 

state senate candidacy Homecoming 

set at DHS education, and taxation de-
mand that we have the best 
qualified persons possible 
serving in our state legisla-
ture. 

promised full federal support 
to stricken farmers. 

"ASCS disaster payments 
will be made routinely, and 
quickly," Bergland said, 
"and I'm going to be in-
structing the Farmers Home 
Administration to get the loan 
program going, to get the 
necessary loans made or ex-
tended as quickly as possi-
ble." 

He added, "We have stat-
utory limits in the Farmers 
Home Administration as to 
how much we can loan for 
operating purposes. But there 
is no limit on disaster loans, 
and we intend to use them to 
the fullest extent—especially 
for the farmers who have 
been hit three years in a 
row." 

Congressman Kent Hance, 
who arranged Bergland's 
tour, termed it a "highly suc-
cessful" effort. 
''The Secretary said he 

would get the Farmers Home 
Administration to do every-
thing possible to make new 
loans, extend old loans, and 
to avoid foreclosures if at all 
possible," Hance said. 

Hance had proposed a 20% 
reduction in outstanding 
FmHA loans to hail-stricken 

with the budget process, it 
would be very, very difficult 
to get the 20% reduction," 
Hance said. "I thought it 
would be difficult, so I was 
hoping to get a compromise 
solution—a five-year exten-
sion of present loans and a 
pledge against foreclosures. 
The Secretary agreed to this, 
and I think this is the most 
important accomplishment we 
had at this meeting." 

Bergland also said he'd like 
to see future USDA programs 
tailored to fit the needs of 
different areas, instead of be-
ing generalized on the basis 
of national averages. 

Fielding reporters' ques-
tions in a hailed-out cotton 
field near Littlefield, Bergland 
said, "The main reason I'm 
here is to see if we can't for-
mulate some programs that 
are tailor-made for individual 
areas and situations such as 
exist here." 

In the past, he said, farm 
programs have been written 
in general terms, "but the 
problems here are consider-
ably different than those in 
New York, Minnesota or 
Maine." 

He specifically mentioned 
the federal crop insurance 

"I pledge to the 31st Dis-
trict that, when elected, I can 
and will dedicate my time to 
being a servant of the people 
of District 31, a senator that 
the people can be proud to 
have representing them," 
McCathern said. 

Gerald McCathern of Here-
ford became the first an-
nounced candidate for State 
Senator from District 31. the 
seat now held by Republican 
Bob Price of Pampa, when he 
confirmed at a news confer-
ence last week that he will 
be in the Democratic primary 
race. 

program. Saying that the old 
ofograrn "wasn't very 	gyro, 
really," he outlined plans for 
a new crop insurance program 
that could be tailored for dif-
ferent areas according to cost 
of production, risk factors and 
crop history, "which I think 
will be a tremendous improve-
ment over what we've had in 
the past," 

During the Thursday mor-
ning tour and at a public 
meeting in the Lubbock Civic 
Center auditorium that after-
noon, Bergland defended the 
Carter Administration's farm 
policies—especially the grain 
reserve and export programs 
—and ruled out the "bushel 
of wheat for a barrel of oil" 
idea as unrealistic. 

Present farm programs 
"are better than they have 
been," he said, and have re-
sulted in higher prices for 
farm products this year, "ex-
cept in a few places." 

"If it weren't for the grain 
reserve program, corn prices 
this year would be a disaster, 
with the record corn crop—
they'd be down there around 
the loan rate," the Secretary 
commented. 

The oil-producing countries 
of the Middle East, he said, 
"don't need our wheat nearly 
as badly as we need their oil. 
If we go up on our price, 
they'll simply go elsewhere. 
We don't have that much 
muscle with them, and after 
all, how big is Saudi Arabia? 
Six million people—half as 
many as Texas." 

He said an increase in US 
grain prices could also jeopar-
dize exports to Japan and 
other nations that are large-
volume buyers of US com-
modities. He also said that 
poor nations would have to 
cut their present imports of 
US farm products if the US 
raised prices "because they 
won't have any more money 
than they have now to spend 
for our grain—they could use 
more of our grain, but they're 

File this away 

for future use 
Secretary of Agriculture 

Bob Bergland said it last 
Thursday, while standing in 
Billy Smith's hailed-out cotton 
field near Littlefield: 

"Ted Kennedy won't run 

Record kigk 

"I've been in 14 campaigns 
in 30 years, losing two and 
winning the rest. With that 
number of years, you develop 
some instincts, and my in-
stinct is that Ted Kennedy 
won't run (for the Democratic 
presidential nomination). 

"It would be foolish for him 
to get iirto a knock-down, 
drag-out fight with President 
Carter. It doesn't make any 
political sense. 

'fl knew what I'm talking 
uttut —1'm from Minnesota, 
and up there we Democrats 
get into a big split and fight 
about every 10 years. and 
hand it over to the Repub-
licans." 

[Readings recorded at 7 
a.m. daily for the preceding 
24 hours.] 

Hi Lo Pr. 
Thursday 	 80 49 
Friday 	83 48 
Saturday 	72 50 Tr. 
Sunday 	 86 50 
Monday 	91 60 
Tuesday 	 94 50 
Wednesday 	 92 50 
September Moisture 	1  75 
1979 Moisture 	 16.90 

KDHN RADIO 
US Weather Observer 

JUBILATION—This is all you need to know about the annual 
Hart-Nazareth shootout Friday night at Nazareth. The 
blue-clad Swifts gather in celebration at midfield after the final 
buzzer to celebrate their 7-0 victory over their intra-county 
rivals. The arm in the middle, with a sleeve on it, belongs to 

Two other Hereford men, 
Clint Formby and Bill Sar-
palius, as well as Mel Phillips 
of Amarillo have said they are 
considering making the race 
but have not announced for-
mally. 

"I feel that my educational 
and business background re-
flects my qualifications to the 
people of District 31," Mc-
Cathern said. "I can relate to 
the problems of all the peo-
ple—labor, business, educa-
tors, the oil and gas industry, 
as well as agriculture." 

McCathern is past chair-
man of the agriculture com-
mittee of the Deaf Smith 
County Chamber of Com-
merce, voted outstanding 
farmer in Deaf Smith County 
in 1968 by the Lions Club, 
served as vice-president of 
the Texas State National 
Farmers Organization, secre-
tary of the Texas Grain Sor-
ghum Producers Board, a 
director of dui Ali; • Feed 
Grains Council and was a 
leader in the American Ag-
riculture Movement. 

"The problems confronting 
us today in energy, inflation, 

Homecoming week for Dim-
mitt High School will be cli-
maxed by the Bobcat-Tulia 
game to be played at 8 p.m. 
Oct. 5 at Bobcat Stadium. 

Students will come to 
school dressed in their west-
ern attire Tuesday for western 
day at DHS. Hall decoration 
night will begin at 4 p.m. 
Tuesday, and the students 
will have until 9 p.m. to 
decorate the high school halls 
for Spirit Week. 

Class T-shirts will be worn 
on class day, Wednesday. 

Trash day is Wednesday. 
School will dismiss at 2:40 
p.m. to give the students an 
opportunity to collect trash for 
the bonfire next Thursday 
night, where the Flame King 
and Queen will be presented 
and crowned. 

The bonfire will be held at 8 
p.m. Thursday east of the 
high school gym. 

The public is invited to at-
tend the pep rally Friday. The 
annual FHA barbecue will be 
served from 5-7 p.m. in the 
East cafeteria at Richardson 
Elementary School. 

Students will come to 
school Friday dressed in their 
best attire for the school's 
dress-up day. 

The Spirit Week dance will 
be field in the west cafeteria 
at Richardson Elementary 
School after the game. 

Homecoming in the Nan-
reth School is planned for Oct. 
12 and Hart plans its home-
coming. for Oct. 19. 

NHS Head Coach Eddie Hooper. In left foreground is Assistant 
Coach Bud Birks. The Swifts scored in the first quarter, then 
held off five scoring threats by the visiting Longhorns to 
capture the victory, their first of the season. 



BEFORE YOU BUY! 
CHECK LINDSAY'S LIFETIME 

CORROSION GUARANTEE 

OCC;7mInatie 
CENTER PIVOT SYSTEMS 

IQ OAD D 

christian irrigation, inc. 
800 E. 6th. 	 Plainview 	 29343:17 
Call Dean Allen 
Box 423 
Olton, TX. 79064 
806-285-207T 

Hereford Office 
364-6400 
Earth Office 
257-3855 

S 

Man and woman began their married 

life in church and according to God's 

holy word are joined together. With 

the Bible as the basis for the beginning 

of a new life together, it seems only 

reasonable that a continued study of 

God's word would strengthen and serve 

as a guide to any couple. The Bible can 

truly serve as a tie that will bind two 

together in accord. The church as God's 

agency on earth can help you 

in Bible study, and with the 

guidance of the Holy Spirit 

can help you to understand 

God's will in your life. 

"And the Lord shall guide thee 

continually, and satisfy thy 

soul in drought, and make fat 

thy bones;  and thou shalt be 

like a watered garden, and 

like a spring of water, whose 

waters foil not. Isaiah 58-11 

The Church is God's oppointed agency in this world for spreading the knowledge of His love 

for mon and of His demand for man to respond to that love by loving his neighbor. Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no government or society or way of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even 

from o selfish point of view, one should support the Church for the sake of the welfare 

of himself and his family. Beyond that, however, every person should uphold and par-

ticipate in the Church because it tells the truth about man's life, death and destiny; the 

truth which alone will set him free to live as a child of God. 
Coleman Adv. Ser. 
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Bridge tourney is one feature of Caribbean trip 
By MYRTLE SHEFFY from Floydada. Ceal Carlile and Edith 

Graeff are home from their 
16-day trip to Alaska. They 
flew to Los Angeles and there 
took the Love Boat Cruise to 
the North State. Ceal says 
they did all the tours. It was 
lovely down that narrow wa-
terway pass. The most mem-
orable sight was icebergs with 
rainbow colors, where the 
cracks in the ice are and the 
sun shines on. It is a beautiful 
deep blue. Many parties were 
held on the ship. She danced 
with the Captain, quite an 
honor. Didn't talk to Edith, 
but they think the trip was 
well worth going on. 

Eddie and June Sutton have 
moved into their new home on 
Sunset Circle. Sunday mor-
ning at 6 a group of "so 
called" friends went out to 
warm the house. They did 
take bacon and eggs so all 
could eat. These are the 
friends, Jerry and Patti Cart-
wright. Gary and Linda Lang-
ford, Bill and Suzan Sanders, 
Ronnie and Connie Kenmore 
and Rhonda Schaeffer. The 
Mr. couldn't make it. 

hearing Johnny Cash sing, 
also others. 

who had been to the Amarillo 
Fair. He had money his 
grandparents gave him. They 
are Mr. and Mrs. Brotherton 
from Morton. Well, the story. 
Brian worked and worked, 
spent his money to get a gold 
fish, then had to go to town 
and buy a bowl for him. Brian 
says he is a very special fish. 
Someone said their kids' mo-
ney went trying to get a teddy 
bear. Many people enjoyed_ 

Margaret and Ray Nelson 
have returned home from four 
weeks in Corpus Christi. 
Ray's trucks have been run-
ning out of there for several,  
weeks. It rained almost every 
day and they took a look at 
the oil spills on the beaches at 
Padre Island. 
[See CHATTER, Page 51 

Church Sunday. He was visit-
ing friends, too, and says he 
is a second cousin of minister 
Howard Quiett. 

Joe and Nancy Upton are 
here from Madill, Okla. for a 
visit with her dad Leland Lee 
and sister Carolyn Copeland 
and the aunts Allie Mae Wil-
lis and Anita and Peewee 
Morris. 

At the cafe I was chatting 
with young Brian Stewart, 

Beral Hance watched the 
Tech Red Raiders play Ari-
zona Saturday. Dimmitt's 
Dennis Veals of Tech was 
playing. I didn't get details, 
maybe you did. 

Dr. and Mrs. Weldon But-
ler, he is District Superin-
tendent of the Methodist 
Plainview District, was a 
guest at Dimmitt's Methodist 

We do wish for him a speedy 
recovery. 

Dale and Janet Broadstreet 
went to Lubbock Sunday for a 
visit with her parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Lovall. They also 
went to the Fair. You can see 
Janet in the gift department 
at Parsons Drug. 

Eleven members of the 
Senior Citizens went to Ama-
rillo to see the Fair and other 
entertainment. Clara Dollar is 
the driver of the van. I know 
that Wilda Hawkins went, 
also Mae and Amzie Taylor, 
nine others. Do go to the 
"42" parties at the Senior 
Citizens' club each Tuesday 
evening at 7. 

C. W. Boothe was 99 years 
old Sept. 18. He lives at South 
Hills Manor. He isn't very 
well, but can be in his wheel 
chair. Mr. Boothe came to 
Castro County in 1928, was an 
elevator man and owned land. 
His children are Truett and 
Johnnie and Bessie and Dent 
Bradley, Dan and Lois, who 
came from Hollis, Okla. All 
went out for a visit. He and 
his family came to Dimmitt 

Gladys Benson, Faun Wel-
ker and Mrs. John Blaine, or 
Juanita, and her friend Edith 
Stanfer of Plainview are home 
from a jet trip to beautiful 
Puerto Rico and San Juan City 
in the Caribbean. This was to 
attend a national bridge tour-
nament of six days. The direc-
tor of games was from Can-
ada. Many people from the 
)Sallas-Fort Worth area and 
More from Florida than any 
other state. The girls didn't 
win first but had fun there 
and the tour of the islands—
beautiful place, palm trees, 
bananas, and they enjoyed 
fresh pineapple juice. Saw the 
old fort, or as it is called, The 
Castillo, San Felipe Del Mor-
ro. That was built by Spain in 
1766-1772. It faces the sea 
With big guns to guard the 
place. Puerto Rico has lovely 
homes and government build-
ings (some not so pretty) 
waterfalls, fruit markets and a 
fine view of the sea. 

She helped with the grand 
opening. 

Loys Raymer, the artist, is 
in New York City for a few 
days. A few years ago she 
lived in the pretty town of 
Kerrville, that is in the Hill 
Country. 

Joylyn Broderson and Don-
na Schilling went to Six Flags 
last weekend. Donna says 
they made all the rides and 
stuff like that. 

Jettie Sheffy spent a few 
days at Brownwood visiting 
her daughter Oneta and hus-
band Jim Gregg, coming back 
by Mangum, Okla. to see 
about some property and vis-
iting a sister. 

Shelley Burrous of Child-
ress came home with Cheryl 
Robb for the weekend with 
the Ted Robb family. Both 
girls are students at WTSU at 
Canyon. 

At the Tots and Teens Store 
we chatted with Leanne Cro-
zier and her mother Jackie. 
Leanne is a student at Lub-
bock Christian College, home 
to see Bob and Jackie. The 
grandmother, Gladys Wright, 
has been on the puny list but 
better now. 

Harold Stephens came 
through his heart bypass sur-
gery well and is recuperating 
at a Lubbock hospital. Ted 
and Dorothy Sheffy have been 
with him, as has his family, 
Shirley, John and Margaret 
Womack and aunt Myrna and 
Jack Cowsert, and his mother, 
Mrs. Ozro Stephens of Ama-
rillo. 

I hear that Leonard Demp-
sey suffered a heart attack. 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 

300 West Bedford 

Ph. 647-4464, Dimmitt, TX 

IGLESIA DE CHRISTO 
E. Lee and S. E. Third 

Evangelista — Miguel Zuniga 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all. .7:30 p.m. 

t 

LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ronnie Travis, Pastor 
Phone 647-2300 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services. 8:00 p.m. 

Pat and Polly Patterson 
spent 10 days up in Red River 
Valley. They stayed at Tall 
Pines Lodge. They rested and 
fished for trout. Polly says the 
flowers were extra bright and 
pretty. That is a beautiful 
valley on past Eagle Nest 
Pass and through the colorful 
Cimarron Valley. 

Dick and Leola Sullivan are 
home from a fishing trip to 
Conchas Lake. They had a 
showdown, catching 70 crap-
pie that weighed up to 11/2  
pounds. Before the fishing 
they drove over to Las Vegas, 
N.M. to meet Dick's daughter 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ford Kyes, who came that far 
by train from Pacific Grove, 
Calif. They went home by 
train. They had not had a 
train trip in a long time. The 
Sullivans have a small mobile 
home at the lake. 

Opal Bearden went to Hol-
lis this Wednesday to attend 
the memorial service for her 
brother, Bill Wayne Anderson 
of Dallas. Seems to have been 
heart failure of some kind. 
Bill was only 50 years old and 
her. youngest brother. He was 
a commercial artist. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 
309 N.W. Fourth 

Donald Price, Pastor 
Phone 647-3403 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Night Service.... 6 p.m. 
Wednesday Service... 7:00 p.m. 

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA MEXICANA 

300 N. E. 7th 
Pastor Van E. Hughes

,' 

Secretaria Sara Salinas 
Tesorero Gabriel Montiel 

Domingo: 
Estudios Bibliocos 	10:00 a.m. 
El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m. 
Miercoles: 
Instruccion Biblica.... 8:00 p.m. 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

,i.s.***************; 
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CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
5th and Halsell 

Rev. Delbert Fish, Pastor 
Phone 647-2651 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	630 p.m. 
Wednesday Service. 7:00 p.m. 

* 

* 

* 

John Travoita 
Olivia 	< 11; 

Newton-John 

is the word %-itiH; 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Howard Quiett, Pastor 
110 S. W. Third 

Phone 647-4106 or 647-4107 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	10:45 a.m. 
MYF, Jr. Hi & Sr. Hi 	 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	630 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
General Meeting 
WSCS 	 9.30 a.m. 
Choir 	  7:30 p.m. 

LA ASAMBLEA CRISTIANA 
"Full Gospel" 

S.W. 5th, 807 B. 
Pastor Ruben Velasquez 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Night 	 5:30 p.m. 
Wed. Night 	700 p.m. 

Friday, Saturday 
& Sunday 

* 
* 
* 
* 
* 

* 
* 
	* 
* 

* 
* 
* 
* 
* 

**************41.420
* 

The Senior Citizens have 
been very busy these days. 48 
people came to the Tuesday 
night supper and party. "42" 
was the game. And one day 
guests Gerald DeViney of 
Austin and Barbara Serres of 
Amarillo came to see the new-
ly decorated club house. Mrs. 
Carlile loaned several of her 
oil paintings to decorate the 
house for the fair visitors. 

And the ladies have several 
pretty quilts for sale. And 
there is a special room where 
clothes "like a garage sale" 
are shown. Come see and 
buy. Peggy West, the direc-
tor, welcomes guests and new 
members. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Slayton 
were here from Roseburg, 
Ore. visiting their kin Gene 
and Connie Ivey and Coy and 
Nora Dunn. The lveys had the 
family get together at the 
Littlefield community room 
last Sunday. Many came from 
Oregon, Mississippi, El Paso 
and all around this area. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Rice and 
baby of Wichita Falls were 
weekend guests of families, 
the James Sloughs and the 
Tom Mosses. 

The Shoe Tree people were 
hostesses at an open house 
Friday and Saturday. Quite a 
crowd came by to see the 
shoes and cloth. Owners are 
Jimmy Schulte and daughter 
Lynn. Their daughter Louie 
Wethington painted the sign. 
Do go see it and the store. Go 
in at the door at Carolyn Raw-
lings Jones' office. Florene 
Brockman served those good 
home baked cinnamon rolls 
and cakes and coffee. Visiting 
at the coffee table with me 
were Shirley Hall, Rose Ack-
er, Jerry Marvin of KDHN, 
April Guy from the News, 
Alan Newman, Mayor Youts, 
Mrs. Paul Acker and Max 
Martinez. Dorothy Mayfield 
came by in a hurry and 
Leonard Schuite, doing some 
of the chores for Jimmie. 

Bernie Wethington, a truck 
driver, made a trip to Ok-
lahoma City, will be gone a 
week. His wife Louie and 
babies are at the Schultes. 

CARLILE 
geheatee 

Dimmitt, Texas 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
DEL PRIMOJENITO 

East Halsell St. 
Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Sermon 	  11:00 a.m. 
Lord's Supper and 

Feet Washing 	 11.30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	7:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Services.. 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 
Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6'00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Choir Rehearsal 	8:10 p.m. 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 
Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9'45 a.m. 
Morning Worship and 

Lord's Supper 	 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6'00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Study 	7:30 p.m. 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
Carl McKinney, Pastor 

302 S. E. 2nd 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Christ Ambassadors and 
Children's Church 	 6:00 p.m. 
Evangelistic Service 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service. . . 7:30 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 
Dale Wells, Minister 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9'30 a.m. 
Morning Worship....10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 	710 p.m. 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Raymond Jones, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday — 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 p.m. 

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
501 S.E. 3rd 

Pastor, Rev. Kenneth Carroll 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 	710 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 p.m. 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 
1101 W. Halsell — Ph. 647-4219 
Sunday— 
Mass in English 	 7.00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	 10:30 a.m. 
Religion Classes 	930 a.m. 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday—!  
Mass 	  7:00 a.m. 
Holy Days— 
Mass in English 	 7:00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish... 	8:00 p.m. 
Confessions— 
Friday 	TOO to 8:00 p.m.  
Baptism by Appointment 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Western Circle Drive 

Rev. Ed Manning, Minister 
Sunday— 
Church School 	10:00 a.m.  
Common Worship... 11:00 a.m.  

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

412 North East Street 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	600 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO  p.m. 
Monday W.M.0 	 4:30 p.m. 
Tuesday Brotherhood 	 7:55 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Sanctuary Cttir 	 Friday 

Your Need to Contact Us For.... 

EXPERT REPAIRS 
ON YOUR 
LPG EQUIPMENT 

We have the materials and skill to give you expert 
service on all of your LPG equipment. You will save 
time, money and trouble by letting us put your LPG 
equipped vehicles and equipment in first class working 
order. 

Because of shortage of materials we are limited on the 
number of LPG conversions we can make. However, 
we will be happy to make your cpnversions as 
materials become available. 

VARDELL FUELS 
Highway 86 East 	 Phone 647-3174 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	710 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services... 7:30 p.m. 

Published Through 
HAYS IMPLEMENT 

GOODPASTURE, INC. 
1Dimmitt Plant] 

FIRST STATE BANK 

the Cooperation of the Local Ministerial Association and Sponsored by the Undersigned Individuals and Business Institutions 
CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 	HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. 

SEALE FLORIST 
Ph. 647-3554 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 
DIMMITT TV CABLE 

DENNIS FLORAL & GIFTS 
Across From the Hospital 

647-3191 

DIMMITT '66' INC. 

C&S EQUIPMENT CO. 
1 



Liptons 
Instant TEA 

Plains 
Low Fat MILK 

Green Giant 
Whole Kernal 
Cream Style CORN 

Barra 
Strawberry JAM 

69 

DOG FOOD Hi-Pro 	
1304lb $999 

SHORTENING  
Mrs. Tucker 

rs42 °z $1 39 

COOKING 0 I Chlt4:77n "e $ 1 
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DIMMITT 
UPER MARKET 

1* 

103 Belsher Street, Dimmitt Store Hours: 7 a.m. 'til 9 p.m. 

We Give Double Gunn Bros. Stamps On Tuesdays And Wednesday 

SPECIALS GOOD SEPT 27 THRU OCT. 3 

READY TO 

r
PLEASE 

hOZIN r00175 
Maryland Club 

All Grinds lib $299 

17 
0,594 

60 Count $599 

	64' 
0, $1 89 

CHILI

Swift With Beans 

Green Giant 
STUFFED 

PEPPER 
14 oz. 

$129 

COFFEE 

Famland 
SAUSAGE 

LINKS 

89c Plains 

Square Carton 	Gal.  994 12 oz. Pkg. ICE CREAM 

Green Giant 

BROCCOLI 
IN CHEESE SAUCE 

10 oz. 

59` 
.44 	-41P-414 

EL EEDILIIIMII 
DRUG DEPT. 

CLOSE-UP 16 oz  3/$1 

2 	jar$ 1 39 

32'z 	 89 

Toothpaste 
6.4 oz. Tube 

99C 

CONTAC 
Cold Capsules 

10 Count 

$139 

TYLENOL 
Pain Releiver 
100 Count 

$179 
Jergens 

Gentle Touch 	4.75 oz.  3/$1 

$1 59 DOUBLE BARRELED SPECIALS 	lb. 
WITH FILLED GUNN BROS. SUPER DISCOUNT BOOKLETS 

MARGARINE  F,eischmann
Qua, rithers79 

stSt. Chicken of Sea 

TUNA 
61/2 oz. 

Fresh Packed 

FRYER 

THIGHS 

lb. 69` 
Oil or 

Water Pack 

0.4 Imperial 

4°11' SUGAR 
5 IL Bag 

59C 
With Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

4. 	Kraft 

MIRACLE 
c°'' WHIP 

Quart 

19C 
With Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

04 Wolf 

A°tt CHILI 
19 oz. Can 

Jennie '0 

TURKEY 
SLICES AND GRAVEY 

$1 69 49C 49C 
2 IL Pkg. Will F~ch Fill. Gunn .9, ElOokle, 	With Each Filled Gunn Bros. Booklet 

	48 *I 	 
6110106106114106111461111101011610101011  

SYRUP White Swan 

Boma 
Grape JELLY 

THE CASTRO COUNTY 

N 

Farmland 
HAM 

PATTIES 

$1 29 
12 oz. Can 

Green Giant 
Green Giant 

BROCCOLI 
CABBAGE 

SPEARS 
ROLL IN SAUCE 14 oz. 

X129 59` 

Extra 
Absorbent 

Pillsbury 
Layer Cake 

PAMPERS 

CAKE MIX Wholesun 

ORANGE 	Green Gin' 
JUICE LASAGNA 

12 oz. Can 	21 oz. Pkg. 

79` 
$179 

Gal $1 79 

Green Giant 
CA 	16 oz. 

Shoulder CA 

PORK 

ROAST 

0 it, 99c 

Fresh Ground 
BEEF 

PATTIES 4: 
$ 89 
1lb. 

USDA Choice 

CHUCK 

STEAK 

32 w.  994 
2:0Igb. $399  

PRELL JERGENS 
Shampoo 	Lotion 
5 oz. Tube 	6 oz. Bottle 

$1 59 89` 
FLOUR  Light cr- 

BAR SOAP 

4441444444444444444444444444 ........ 44 

COCA-COLA 
Os 	$139 32 oz. 

TAB 	6 Pack 
Plus Deposit 
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Atli ADS ARE YOUR BEST BOY I 

a 

5140P / 
COMPARE /  

***************** * 
* "We appreciate the 
*  
* opportunity to help you * 
* with your Real Estate * 
* Needs." *  
* 
* Lovely brick home, ap-

*  
* proximately 2057 sq. 
* ft., 3 bedroom, 2 bath,  * 
* nice patio, double-car 
• garage, with many  * 

* 
* extras that are only * 
* found with a custom-  * 	 * 
* built home. 
* * 
* NICE BRICK home with * 
*approximately

* 
 2,000 * 

* square feet, 3 bedrooms, * 
* * 1 3/4 	 * baths, basement, * 
* large family room, nice * 
* * landscaped yard. 	* 

* 
* 	 * 
* Large home, well loca- * 
* ted, 3 bedroom, 3 * 

* k  bath, 2 kitchens, base- 
* 

 
ment, intercom sys- * 

* tern, den with fire-i 
*  
* place, all purpose * 
* room, double car gar- * 
* 	 * 
* age, extra large lot. * 
* Owner leaving! 	* 
* 	 * 
* * 
* Two bedroom remodel- * 
* • ed, with fenced back- : 
* yard, cellar and metal * 
* shop. 
*  
* 	 * 
* 	 * 
* FARMS * 
* 	 * 
* Cas 	C nt 3  ac * - 

* * re 	e n arid`pne  
* 1 	I 	•Siod * * 
* * 

GEORGE 
* 	REAL ESTATE 	* 

* 
* Hwy. 385 South * 

* Jimmie R. George 	* 
* Broker 	* 

* Office 	647-4174 *. 

* * Danny Rice 647-3552 
Dub George 647-4469 * 

* 
?ki*************** 

•• • sa •...aasataamun• • • 

1— REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND 

8—SERVICES 3—FOR SALE, MISC: ! 14—CARD OF THANKS]: 4, _ _ 
CARD OF THANKS 

We appreciate so much the 
kind expressions of sympathy 
shown our family during the 
loss of our loved one. The pray-
ers, cards and memorials will 
always be remembered. May: 
God bless each of you. 

THE FAMILY OF W. E. 
THOMPSON; 

14-52-1tc: 

11— LIVESTOCK, PETS 8—SERVICES 6— AUTOMOTIVE 

SEE 1-1-00R-  inaenen-dent 
surance agent for Complete in-
surance service. Ivey Agency; 
210 W. Bedford, 647-3518. 

8-6-tfc 

WANT TO HARVEST Sun-
flowers for you. 647-5461. 

8-46-tic 

1974 CHEVROLET Half-ton 
pickup. Power, air, relatively 
low mileage. Call 647-5489 or 
come  by 701 Pine. 	6-48-tfc 

GLASS1 1 

FOR SALE: 1978 14x80 Soli- 
taire mobile home. Like new.,  
Call 647-4178 or after 6:00 p.m. 
call 938-2325. 	3-33-tic 

WHEAT PASTURE - Stalkfield 
cows! Can ship load lots (55-60 
head) of choice running age 
cows. Ideal for fall and winter 
grazing. All cows pregnancy 
tested, mouthed, and Bangs 
negative. Also have several 
sets of keeping kind of cows. 
Cows shipped from near Tulsa, 
Ok. or Clovis, N.M S. Wat-
kins, 806-797-5749, Lubbock, 
TX. 	 11-51-4W 

FOR SHAKLEE, fine personal 
care products, bio-degradable 
household products, nutritional 
supplements in foods, call 647-
5227 for more information. 

3-39-tfc 

CESSPOOL PUMPING call C. 
W. Yates, or Bobby Campbell 
647-4318 or 647-5211. 8-43-tfc 

PIANO LESSONS after school 
hours. Call 647-5567 after 4 
p.m. on weekdays. 411 W. 
Jones. 	 8-52-tic 

PUBLISHER'S NOTICE: 
All real estate advertised in 
this newspaper is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference, 
limitation, or discrimination 
based on race, color, religion, 
sex, or national origin, or an 
intention to make any such pre-
ference, limitation, or discrim-
ination." 
This newspaper will not know-
ingly accept any advertising for 
real estate which is in violation 
of the law. Our readers are 
informed that dwellings adver-
tising in this newspaper are 
available on an equal oppor- 
tunity basis. 	1-28-tic 

FOR SALE to settle estate: 200 
acres of land, two 8 inch wells, 
underground tile, $950 per 
acre, Hart, Texas. Contact 
Dean Sanders, Hart, Texas, 
938-2217 	 1-33-tfc 

NICE 3-bedroom brick home. 
Den, 1 3/4  bath, large lot, fenced 
yard, two-car garage. Call 
647-5410 after 5. 	1-43-tfc 

THREE-BEDROOM HOUSE 
for sale by owner. Carpeted, 
large living room, 13/4  baths, 
family room, utility room, on 
corner lot. Also includes two 
attached one-bedroom apart-
ments, presently rented. More 
than 2,000 sq. ft. overall. Call 
647-5465 after 5 p.m. 	1-47-tfc 

FOR SALE: House and lot in 
Hart. Call 938-2557 after 5:30 
p.m. 	 1-52-4tc 

9—HELP WANTED 
IF a glass of water were the 

size of the earth, the individ-
ual molecules of water would 
be about the size of grape-
fruits. 

ALTO SAXOPHONE — $175. 
All reconditioned. Call or see at 
Sears. 	 3-50-tic 

FOR SALE: Walken Oats, 945- 
2566. 	 3-51-3tp 

Large stock of flat glass for 
combine and tractor cabs, etc. 
Wholesale and retail on L-O-F, 
Pittsburgh and Carlite wind 
shield glass. Installed right and 
weather-tight. See Gene at 
Dimmitt Upholstery & Garage ,1  
214 N. Broadway, 647-2534. 

6-52-tfc 
FOR SALE: Small Ford tractor 
and shredder. Ph. 647-3548 
after 6 p.m. 	 6-52-tic PUREBRED DUROC boars; 

2 6-inch pumps; 1966 Pontiac. 
945-2675. 	 3-48-tfc Tees Office of Traffic Safety FOR SALE: 1974 Cadillac, low 

mileage, loaded. Ph. 647-3548 
after 6 p.m. 	 6-52-tic 

125% SAVINGS on State Farm' 
Homeowner Insurance!!!! SEE 
how much you may save by 
insuring your HOME, CAR, 
LIFE and HEALTH with KENT 
BIRDWELL INSURANCE, 116 
E. Jones St., Dimmitt, Texas, 
647-3427. 	 8-3-tfc 

DEAD STOCK remevil, 7-day 
(week service. Please call soon 
ias possible. Hereford Bi-Prot  
;ducts. Phone 364-0951, 8-3-tfc 

CRANE AND DRAG LINE ser-
vice. Tailwater pits cleaned., 
B&R Welding, 364-3201, Here- 
ford. 	 8-20-tfd 

GILLILAND LANDSCAPING:' 
For new lawns, new trees and 
tree trimming, shrubs, tractor 
services and complete land-
scaping services. Will land- 
	cape new building sites. Free 
'estimates. Gardens, rototilling, 
plowing and listing. Randy at 
647-2622 or Leon, 647-2448. 

8-32-tfc 

REst TAKE A 
a'a BREAK 

13—LOST & FOUND  j 

FOUND: Small puppy. Brown 
with black nose. Please call 
647-4478 after 5 p.m. 

13-52-1te 

COORDINATOR POSITION 
AVAILABLE: To coordinate 
and supervise minor home re-
pairs program. Must have a 
pickup and valid drivers lic-
ense. Salary open. Contact Paul 
Catoe at Castro County Com-
munity Action, 412 N.W. 3rd, 
Dimmitt, Texas. We are an 
equal opportunity/affirmative 
action employer. 	9-49-tic 

DIMMITT AGRI INDUSTRIES 
has permanent and temporary 
openings available for Scale 
Operators, Electrician, and 
Fertilizer Service Man. Apply 
in person to Ron Miller or Gary 
Moore at our farm store. 

9-50-tic 

7—BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES 

Irrigation Pipe 
Concrete or Plastic 

Underground 

Pipe Repair 
BACKHOE WORK 

945-2535 Day 
Nazareth, Texas 79063 

STOP PAINTING 

Cover all outside wood 
with U.S. Steel Products 
siding and overhang. 

Free Estimates 

STAN-BY 
Steel Siding 

1501 N. Columbia 
Plainview, Tx. 
Ph. 293-9330 

CHRISTMAS latchhook kits, 
needlepoint stockings, bell 
pulls, piano benches, chair seat 
sets. Elsa Williams crewel kits, 
needlepoint and latchhook can-
vases to make your own de-
signs. Over 500 colors needle-
point yarns. DAN'S of Canyon. 

3-48-5tc 
THERMOPHORE (the" Into: 
matic moist heat pack) by, 
Battle Creek now available at 
Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tfcr, 

FOR SALE—Hillcrest mobile 
home, 12 x 54'. R. E. Hunter. 
647-2456. 	 3-45-tic 

BOAT FOR SALE: 17-ft fiber-
glass, with 75-hp Evinrude and 
trailer. $1,250. 647-3392. 

3-28-tfc 

HOUSEKEEPER wanted, 647- 
2170. 	 9-52-tfc 

ON THE FARM tractor and 
combine air conditioner repair 
and service. JIM'S FARM A/C,  
SERVICE, call 647-5310 or' 
647-3127. 	 8-20-tfc 

RENTAL color TVs. Kittrell 
Electronics. 	 8-51-tfc 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY: 
For public stenographer. Con-
tact Tina Rawlings, 121 E. 
Bedford. 	 7-24-tic 
HAVE A HIGHLY profitable & 
beautiful Jean shop of your 
own. Featuring the latest in 
jeans, denims, tops & sports-
wear. $15,500.00 includes be-
ginning inventory, fixtures & 
training. Can be open within 15 
days. Call anytime for Mr. 
Hartley at (505) 662-2537. 

7-52-1tp 

BI-LINGUAL billing clerk want-
ed to work for non-profit med-
ical organization. High school 
or GED required. Contact Paul 
Catoe at 412 NW 3rd, Dimmitt. 
An Equal Employment/Affir-
mative Action Employer. 

9-52-2W 

INSULATION—Homes and 
steel buildings. Call Air-Tite 
Insulation Co. or see Robert 
Daniel, 647-2372. 	8-3-tic 

WILL DO Rota-tilling, lawn 
mowing, yard work. Call 647- 
4365. 	 8-35-tic 

TREE SPRAYING, custom tree 
and landscape service. T. J. 
Carter, Tex. lic. PCL-1440pt-
LOW. Amarillo 373-4593, Dim-
mitt representative Randy Gil-
liland, 647-2622 or Leon Gilli- 
land 647-2448. 	8-32-tfc 

CHANTEL'S GROOMING SA; 
LON, 210 W. 5th, 364-2048. 
Hereford. 	 8-35-tfc 
REPAIR-OF ALL brands 'of 
major appliances. Dimmitt Ap-
pliance Center, Jim Hrabal. 
647-5690. 	 8-7-tfc 
WEST TEXAS LANDSCAPING: 
If you want your home or bus-
iness landscaped by profession- 
als, Call 364-8282. 	8-34-tfc 

FULKERSON'S DISK ROLL 
ING, efficient, courteous ser-
vice, Robert T. Fulkerson, 806-
995-4689, 719 N. Donley, Tulia 
79088. 	 8-32-tfc 

ARE ROACHES and termites 
your unwanted guests? Call 
Plains Pest Control, Amarillo, 
PCL456PTL, 355-4341. 8-3-52tp 

INTERIOR OR EXTERIOR 
house painting. Contact Paul 
Catoe, 647-2619. Free esti- 
mates. 	 8-49-tic 

8—SERVICES 
PIANO for sale. Upright. Call 
647-5385. 	 3-51-2tp,  

WILL HAVE wheat pasture and 
corn fields, also have 2200 
bales oat hay for large number 
of cattle to winter for someone. 
John B. Lilley, Phone 938-2319. 

3-52-2tp 

2—FOR RENT PIVOT SPRINKLER repair, any 
type. Call Jerry, 647-4562. 

8-43-23tp 

10—WANTED, MISC. Are you seeking change and new opportunities? Are 
you eager to learn new skills and grow with the 
world's leading Helicopter manufacturer? Are you the 
kind of person who desires something better for you 
and your family and who doesn't mind working hard to 
get it? Are you proud of your previous work record? 

TRAILER SPACES for rent,  
FHA approved. 647-2162. 

2-31-tfc 

WANT TO LEASE: Bushhog 
Module Builder. Troy Boykin, 
Childress, TX., Ph. 817-937- 
2109. 	 10-50-3tp APARTMENT for -rent, Conn= 

try Arms Apartments, 111 NW J 
11th, 647-3318. 	2-234k 

OFFICE AND BUSINESS space 
for rent. $1 to $3.50 per square 
foot. 121 E. Bedford. 

2-19-tfc 

2—FOR RENT 

MUST HAVE someone with 
good credit to assume low bal-
ance on current model organ in 
excellent condition. Organ has 
one finger play, magic fingers 
two keyboards, full 13 note 
pedal board, drums, rhythms, 
and all extras. Call Mr. Jim 
Madden person to person col- 
lect at 214-296-0820. 	3-52-1tp 

If the above statements fit you, then consider the 
opportunities that now exist in the areas of Aircraft 
Structural Assembly and Material Bonding at Bell 
Helicopter. If selected, you will receive paid classroom 
and on-the-job training to qualify you .for these 
positions. 

PIANO LESSONS: Call Amy 
Cole, 647-5369. 	8-49-4tc 

LET US make you an estimate 
on Targonal bath and kitchen 
floors and walls. TROY KIRBY,. 
647-5351, 	 8-37-tfc 

McKNIGHT SEWING CEN-
TER, 226 N. Main, Hereford. 
Ph. 364-4051. (Singer Auth-
orized Dealer) For full sales 
and service, parts, labor, new 
and used machines and vacuum 
cleaners. Machines and va-
cuums in Dimmitt, call 647-
2552 before 8 a.m. or after 4 
p.m. and all day Saturday. 

8-49-tic 

FOR RENT: 2-Bedroom unfurn-
ished apartment bath and half, 
fully carpeted, kitchen built-
ins, carport. Ph. 647-5606. 

2-43-tfc 

11—LIVESTOCK, PETSli  
FOR SALE: Palomino mare: 
647-4540. 	 11-31-tic 

RITCHIE LIVESTOCK Water 
& Hydrants, heated & constant,  
flo. Ph. 364-7190, Hereford. ' 

11-10-tic TRAILER SPACE for rent. Call 
Brenda Andrews, 647-2650 or 
647-5463. 	 2 18 tfd 

4—HOUSEHOLD GOODS: 
Bell Helicopter offers excellent pay and benefits. Free 
life and hospitalization insurance and retirement pro-
gram, quarterly cost of living increases, a stock plan, 
and automatic raises every four months. 

• BOBBY GRIEGO 
DRAGLINE SERVICE 

TAILWATER PIT 
CLEANING 

LOADER DOZER 

Phone 364-2322 
Mobile Phone 375-4541 

8-40-tfc 

3—FOR SALE, MISC. 

1. 

GOOD USED color TV. 613 W. 
Andrews, 647-5313. 	4-16-tfc 

FOR SALE: Starr antique pi-
ano, upright, good condition, 
627-4615, Tulia. 	4-52-2tp 

FOR SALE: Upright piano. Call 
938-2557 after 5:30 p.m. 

4-52-4tc 

If unable to come by our employment office at the old 
Amarillo Air Base from 8:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. Monday 
through Friday, please call 335-1551 for further 
information; or write to: 

WALLPAPER HANGING. Ref-
erences. Reasonable rates. Call 
Jimmie Middleton, 258-7715 or 
Jean Collier, 258-7396,i Here-
ford, or 647-4375, Dimmitt. 

8-42-tfc 

SAVE MONEY! Mattresses  
Renovated, New Mattresses 
and Box Springs, any size. For 
appointment, call Running M 
Boot Shop. 647-4264. Dorothy 
Mae Mattress Co. 	8-16-tfc 

$100 REWARD 
For return of Stevens 12-
gauge pump shotgun, Mo-
del 820, taken from vehicle 
on Taylor & Sons parking 
lot. 

FOR SALE: 18-ft. travel trailer, 
fully self-contained, ref. air, 
equalizer-hitch. 647-4625. 

3-51-3tp STORAGE 
SPACES 

FOR RENT 
DIMMITT STORAGE 

& RENTAL 
Box 729 	647-3447 

Bell Helicopter Textron 
Employee Relations 

P.O. Box 31100 
Amarillo, Texas 

HOMEMADE GIFTS for all 
occasions—bridal showers, ba-1  
by showers. Quilts and baby! 
quilts. Senior Citizens Centev 
':Jones and SW Third, 647-2654; 

3-39-tic TEXTRON 

5—FARM EQUIPMENT ,: 

FOR SALE: Miller Offsell 
Discs. For free demonstration 
contact Farmer's Supply Co. 
647-3350. 	 5-41-tfd 

WE REPAIR all makes of fence. 
chargers. Dimmitt Consumers 
Electric Shop, NE 3rd & Etter,I 

5-16-tfO. 
•	  

6—AUTOMOTIVE!:: 

FOR SALE: 1974 Olds "88" 
4-door sedan, exceptionally 
clean. 51800. Call 986-3252, 
Springlake. 	 6-51-2tp 

1977 COACHMAN 25-ft. rec-
reation trailer and 1978 Chev 
rolet Suburban for sale. Will 
sell either or both. Call Don at 
647-3111. 	 6-49-tic 

Amarillo Facility 
P 0 Box 31100. Amarilro TX 79120 

NO QUESTIONS ASKED 

call Gary Reed 

647-5363 or 647-3476 .  

Bell Helicopter 
FASHION TWO TWENTY 
COSMETICS, Lorena Cates,' 
Free demonstration in your 
home or mine, 407 N.W. 3rd, 
647-4210. 	 3-44-26tp 

an equal opportunity employer rn, t 

CARPET CLEANING— Profes-
sional service at reasonable 
prices. 29-hour service. Free 
insurance claim estimates. 
Modern Carpet Center, 647-' 
3452 or 296-9209. 	8-41-tfc 

COMPLETE SMALL ENGINE 
REPAIR SERVICE, tune - ups 
repair, overhauls. Offering 
prompt, courteous service on 
2-cycle or 4-cycle engines. Ver-
non's Engine Repair. 647-3362, 
606 S.W. 6th, Dimmitt. 

8-46-tfc 

ral.••••16K 

Quality 

Mason Shoes 
at Reasonable 

Prices 
•COMFORT 
•STYLE 
•DURABILITY 

647-2402 

WE TAKE TRADES 
ANYTHING 
OF VALUED 

(Cars, boats, motorcycles. 
furniture, trucks, etc.) 
Large selection of 2 and 3 
bedroom mobile homes. 
E-Z payments: Bank rate 
financing available. 
Drive A Little, Save A Lot! 

JJ's MOBILE 
HOMES, INC. 

Texico, New Mexico 
(505) 482-3341 

Justice Real Estate 

HUCKABAY 
REAL ESTATE 

FOR SALE: 

4 bedroom home, 2 
baths, living room, den, 
built ins, refrigerated 
air, double garage, love-
ly yard, Southwest Dim-
mitt, priced to sell. 

3 bedroom home, good 
location, fenced back 
yard, 81/2 % loan can be 
assumed. 

2 bedror-n home, to be 
moved. 
Choice building sites for 
homes. 
Good commercial loca-
tion on Highway 385. 

FOR RENT: 

3 bedroom house, good 
location. 
We have qualified buy-
ers for good farm land in 
Castro County. Give us a 
call or come by and tell 
us how we can be of 
service to you. We want 
your business. 

SINCE 1958 
647-3519 105 E. Bedford 
647-3356 

Kenn Justice, 647-5512 	Cliff Lewis, 647-2454 

115 West Bedford 
Virgil Justice, 647-2159 

647.4101 

COWSERT 
REAL ESTATE 

Home Listings 
1602 Ruskin — 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 2 car garage, fireplace, fence, all 
appliances. 

1601 Sunset Circle — Nearly complete. Approximately 2,150 sq. ft. 
Three bedrooms, two baths, two-car garage, fireplace, large utility 
room. Has sun room/office. 
1100 W. Bedford — 3 bedroom, 1 bath, fenced yard, new carpet and 
several new fixtures. See it today! 

1005 Stinson — 2 bedroom, 1 bath, den, carport, fenced yard, priced to 
sell. 

106 W. Bedford 

Phone 647-3650 	Night 647-2474 

RESIDENTIAL LISTINGS 
90% Home Loans Now Available 

These homes are prices from $18,000 to $39,000 
Brick 3-bedroom, 1 3/4  bath, double car garage, 
plush yard with storage shed, gas grill. 

HUCKABAY 
Offers Complete 

Real Estate Service: 

New Homes 

VPre-Owned Homes 

ye Custom Contracting 

/ Loans 

✓ Farm Land 

I/ Abstracts 

1/ Title Insurance 

/ Hazard Insurance 

Huckabay, 

Abstract Co. 
647-3519 Business 

647-3356 Home 

105 E. Bedford 

Dimmitt 

3-bedroom, 2 full baths, large den, living room. 
Priced to sell. 

REPOSSESSION!! 
Our Loss - Your Gain! 

Take up payments on this 3 
bedroom, 2 full bath home. 
Set up and delivered, air,  
steps, tie downs, etc. 
Check this out today! 
Drive A Little - Save A Lot! 

JJ's MOBILE 
HOMES, INC. 

Texico, New Mexico 
(505) 482-3341  2 bedroom, living room, kitchen, den, full bath, 

downstairs - bedroom, sitting room, full bath 
upstairs. Basement. 

3 bedroom, 1 bath. Priced to sell 

Brick-3 bedroom, living room, den, 1 full and 2 3/c 
baths, double car garage. Approx. 2000 sq. ft. 
with 150' x 190' Lot. 

Farm Listings 
160 Acres — Dodd/Lazbuddie area, strong water and underground 
pipe. 
Half-section — Good water, 2 wells, 2 pivot sprinklers. Dodd area. 

306 acres—North of Dimmitt, nice home, and improvements, 4 wells 
with•return system, low down payment, possible loan assumption. 

640 Acres — Northeast of Dimmitt, 9 wells, lots of underground tile, 

has home and barn. Lays excellent. 

DOUBLE WIDE 
MODULARS11 

See these monsters to be-
lieve them! Featuring 3 
super bedrooms, fireplace, 
garden tubs, storm win-
dows, patio doors, shingle 
roofs, etc. Up to 2,000 
square feet. Delivered to 
your site. See tomorrow's 
home today! 

JJ's MOBILE 
HOMES, INC. 

Texico, New Mexico 
L  (505) 

Large Ic1 with 2 trailer hook-ups. Owner will carry. 

Lot on Pine Street - Real buy ,  

COMMERCIAL LISTINGS 
60 Acres near Dimmitt. Ideal for subdivision. 

320 Acres — Between Dodd and Muleshoe, five wells. Lays beautiful.  

160 ACRES — southwest of Easter. Good six-inch well. 

340 ACRES—Near Arney. Dryland. WE NEED FARM LISTINGS 
Jack Cowsert - Broker 	E. B. Noble - Salesman 



SEALERS 
WETTING AGENTS 
FUEL CONDITIONERS 
LUBRICANTS 
CLEANERS 

RAPID ROOF 
W E X *  

NUTRIENT RELEASE 
AGENT & SURFACTANT ROBERT DUKE 

1011 WEST LEE - DIMMITT, TEXAS 
806/647-5517 z 	 

Now Leasing 

WEST TEXAS 
MINI-STORAGE 

Lock it & Leave it 

647.3427 or 
296-6372 

CONVENIENCE STORES 

WATERMELONS $1" TOMATOES Whole 3/$1°C4  

TUNA Star ' 
	

99` CHARCOAL Ener" $109 
MID FLYING INSECT $799 SUMER 

BAGS 	 NEC.$11.95 EACH 
99 

CAN KILLER 	 

SUGAR S lb. Bag 
	$129 

TEA BAGS 
Lipton 

$179  Family Size 

CORN 5:mutest* 	4/$100  

TOMATOES '"""° 3/$1°D  
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Lunch program 

offered at 
S. C. Center 

0EA chapter 
elects officers 

The Dimmitt Chapter of Of-
fice Education Association el-
ected officers at its meeting 
last Monday in the High 
School 0EA room. 

Those elected were Tina 
Jones, president; Elsa Mon-
tes, vice-president; Janice 
Johnson, secretary; Sheryn 
Derryberry, treasurer; and 
Jeri Mann, reporter. 

They also discussed fund 
raising projects for the year. 
The 0EA students are now 
selling key chains. 

"The organization is look-
ing forward to a second suc-
cessful year,-  Jeri Mann 
said. 

N.H.S. CHEERLEADERS—When enthusiasm is needed at 
Nazareth High School's games this year, these cheerleaders 

help provide it. From left are Diane Hochstein, Lisa Pohlmeier, 
Michele Acker, Joyce Schacher and Tammy Heck. (NHS Photo) 

Senior Citizens are urged U' 
take advantage of the luncl 
program at the Senior Cit: 
zens Center from 11:30 a.m. 
to 12:30 p.m. Mondk 
through Friday. 

"The program is beneficie ' 
to those who live alone as it 
difficult to prepare a meal fo 
one person," Peggy West 
center director, said. "Th 
meals afford a nutritious noon 
meal," she added. 

The price of the meal is on 
a contribution basis, each per. 
son pays what he can afford. 
Mrs. West said. 

Those interested in partici-
pating in the program are 
urged to come to the Senior 
Citizens building for the noon 
meal. Reservations are not 

,necessary. 

Secretaries Association 

plan bosses' banquet 

4 
Flagg Farmers Gin, Inc. 

will be the bosses' banquet to 
be held in January. 

Dr. David Albracht and Dr. 
Carl Hudson from the Al-
bracht Clinic in Amarillo pre-
sented the program on nu-
trition and physical fitness for 
the educational secretary. 

Secretaries attending from 
Dimmitt were Delma Myers, 
Lucille Dollar, Laverne Ber-
nethy, Billye Gwen Davis, 
Elberta Dyer, Dorothy Sheffy 
and Shirley Underwood. 

The Peak of the Panhandle 
Educational Secretaries As-
sociation met for the first time 
this year at the home of Shir-
ley Underwood last Monday 
night. 

After a salad supper, the 
business meeting was con-
ducted during which Dorothy 
Mercer, program chairman, 
distributed new year books 
and explained the theme —
Emphasis on Me, Personally 
— and told something about 
each of the planned pro-
grams. Highlight of the year Hill pledges 

frat at TCU 

Froehner, Joe and Gladys 
Benson, Glen and Koma Rat-
cliff, Weldon and Ruth Skin-
ner, Emmett and Sue Brod-
erson and Joe and Alice 
Cowen. 

Jo Eddie Riley was hostess 
to her bridge club at their 
place southeast of Sunnyside 
Thursday. Good food and cof-
fee were served to Doris Lust, 
Polly Simpson, Ina Cleavin-
ger, Ruth Jackson, Dorothy 
Gilbreath, Sandra Clark, Car-
olyn Jones and Sue Merritt. 
The Riley boys play ball at 
Springlake-Earth school. 

Raymond Hance had lung 
surgery one day last weekend 
at a Vernon hospital. Going to 
be with him were his sister, 
Cletha George, brother Clar-
ence and Leada Hance and 
niece Martha Isaacs. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ira Brown 
went to Santa Fe for a few 
days visit with their two 
daughters. Many things to 
see in that old town. 

Dr. Robert Froehner of Fort 
Worth was a weekend visitor 
in the home of his parents, 
Nolan and Evie Froehner. 

Robert Duke made a busi-
ness trip to Denver. Several 
friends from this area went 
along. Robert sells some kind 
of chemical. And while he was 
gone Frances made a teacher-
related trip to Amarillo. 

Jimmy Cleavinger, a stu-
dent at Tech, was a weekend 
visitor at home, with his par-
ents Jim and Ina and also 
brother Tommy and family. 

Fred and Helen Kuntz were 
hosts at a Sunday dinner and 
visiting time to kin Lilyan An-
thony and Lillian Siementer of 
Clovis and mom Alice An-
thony. 

[Continued from Page 21 

Friends from Wellington, 
Wayne and Jean Cudd, also 
go to Corpus in the summer 
and they and the Nelsons 
have a great time eating out 
and going places. 

Margaret came back by 
Throckmorton for a visit with 
daughter Greta, Stan, her 
husband, and grandchildren, 
Aimee and Juston. 

Greta, Stan and Aimee and 
Juston came up Friday to take 
the kids to the Tri-State Fair. 
Every year at fair time Greta 
meets her college roommate 
and sorority sister, San (Ow-
ens) Clay of Amarillo, and 
they get together and have a 
nice visit. They will spend 
Sunday with Ray and Mar-
garet before returning to their 
home. 

Clint and Mae Cox are 
home from a visiting trip to 
San Angelo, with a niece Mrs. 
J. W. Mackey and sister-in-
law Mrs. F. H. Anderson. 
Mae says a whole bunch of 
nephews came from San An-
gelo, Del Rio and one, Jack 
Swain, from Phoenix, Ariz. 

Jean DuLaney was hostess 
with a luncheon and bridge 
party Tuesday at Somethin' 
Special. LaQuita and Sue 
served those good rolled 
chicken breasts in noodles 
with all the trimmings to 
Martha Isaacs, Roxie Mc-
Lean, Carlee Warren, June 
Sutton, Sue Kemp, Vicki Cla-
ry and Martha Dannevik. 

Mrs. Eunice Thornton was 
hostess to the supper and 
bridge club Thursday eve-
ning. Husband W. E. helped 
serve food to Helen Richard-
son, Faun Welker, Evie 

Only $104' 

ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

BUILDING 
MATERIALS 

CAPABLE. 
DEPENDABLE 

Phone 938-2183 
Hart and Tulle Wilhelm gets 

A&M degree 
Gordon H. Wilhelm of Dim-

mitt received a bachelor's de-
gree as a major in recreation 
and parks at recent summer, 
commencement exercises of 
Texas A&M University. 

Wilhelm was among the 
1,337 students receiving de-
grees, one of 911 undergrad-
uates. There were 324 mas-
ters and 102 doctorates 
awarded. 

(Under new ownership and management) 

Come by for a Free Cup of Coffee, 

Let's Get Acquainted. 
******* 

Our Gin Will Be Ready to Gin Your Cotton... 
Modules or Trailers 

****** 
We are equipped to market your cotton 

by the Telcot System. 

Clay Davis, Manager 

Kelley Hill of Dimmitt is 
among 120 students at Texas 
Christian University who re-
cently pledged fraternities. 
Hill is a pledge of Sigma Al-
pha Epsilon. 

He participated in formal 
rush activities of the eight 
men's Greek-letter organiza-
tions on the TCU campus, and 
received a bid at the end of 
the rush period. 

647.3123 For ilrintkig 

SPECIALS GOOD 
WHILE SUPPLY LAST'S! 

LIMITED SUPPLY!! 

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
SEPT. 27-29,1979 

WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO LIMIT! 

SHOP AND SAVE 
AT ALLSUP'SI 

FALL FOOD SPECIALS 
as. saSsarit,frA 

_-,,Austir's AUTO. 	BOW 11 H0f1E 

pi ft"- 471-7;  ICE 	FROSTY 
*lin CREAM 

BURDEN'S 

BUTTER 80., 
Buttp, 

MILK 

9 CTN. 	

LBilZ ilk 

1 /2  8111. 

BORDEM'S 

	 COTTAGE 
CHEESE 

CTN. 63 

C 
12 OZ. 

POPS - r s 
RD. CTN. 	 KG. 
V2 OAt. 	24 CT. 

P 1 
39 19   Pr- 

AMV/IIPerd 

4010•Allik 

If you would like to get the highest market 
price, or if you are Interested in a 
courteous, efficient grain handling service, 
we will appreciate receiving your corn and 
milt at . 	. 

Flagg Grain Company 
and also at 

Dodd Grain Company 

Ask us about our Wheat Seed Plan. 

Stir 
GIANT 	PURE 
TIDE 	CRISCO 

Ifttx1139 LB. CAN1 99  

MIMING 

TOILET tat 

TISSUE 
4 Roll Pkg, 

69c H 

REG. ELEC. PERK 

FOLGER'S 
COFFEE 

99 
1 LB. 
CAN 

Alla%ete 



A of the best insurance 
agents you'll ever find 

• Car agent • Homeowners agent 
• Life agent • Health agent 

Kent Birdwell 
116 E. Jones St. 

Dimmitt, Texas 79027 
647-3427 

Like o good neighbor. 
State Farm is there. 

STATE FARM INSURANCE COMPANIES 
Home Officer Bloomington. Illinois (

STATE 1 ThARM 

COO° 

INSURANCI 

PUMP EFFICIENCY 
Inefficient pumps cost you money with our 
increased natural gas and electricity bills. 
Big T Pump has the equipment to analyze 
your irrigation system and let you see your 
pump's efficiency. 

A repaired efficient pump by Big T will 
pay for itself in just a short time. 

Call Today for Details 

647-4171 
BIG T PUMP CO., INC. 

George Hudson, Mgr 
Hwy. 385 Dimmitt , Tex. 

THE IDEAL SITUATION 
Is to get a credit bureau 
report before granting 

credit. But, when you are 
troubled with an unpaid 
account, the collection 
service of your credit 
bureau can help you. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
116 W. Bedford  

DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

Allis Chalmers 
Farm Equipment 

White Farm Equipment 
Irrigation Engine 
Sales and Service 

'Phone 647-2573 
P.O. Box 576 

We are prepared to offer you 

fast, efficient, handling of your 

* CORN * MILO 
* SOYBEANS 

We Will Gladly Handle Your 

High Moisture Corn 
In order that you may harvest it before bad weather sets in. 

Top Market Prices for Your Corn, Milo and Soybeans 

Ample Storage for ALL of your Grain 

EASTER GRAIN, INC* Easter, Texas 	Gen Mug, Manager 	Phone (806) 2764255 
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THE first woman rabbi was 

Sally Jane Priesand, ordained 
in June, 1972. 

may 
some 

ho' M. C. ADAMS, 0.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 364-2255 
Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Monday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:30 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 

County corner 
Castro County may not ac-

tually be 30 miles on each 
boundary as provided by the 
Texas Constitution of 1873 
County Surveyor John All-
dredge told the Commission-
ers' Court last week. 

He said that those legis-
lators of the 1870's were nei- 

14S feet off, surveyor says 
they astronomers nor geogra- that this discrepancy 
phers, and did not take into have to be cleared up 
account that the north-south time in the future. 
meridians bend to converge at 
the North Pole. 

When Castro and Swisher 
Counties were surveyed to es-
tablish the original county 
boundaries, two different sur-
veyors were involved, one for 
each county, Alldredge ex-
plained. There is a discrepan-
cy of 145 feet between the two 
surveys at the northeast cor-
ner of Castro and northwest 
corner of Swisher Counties, 
he said. 

Alldredge told the court 

Charlotte Dow 
is elected to 
bank office 

Charlotte Dow, former Dim-
mitt resident who is the 

Alaughter of Mary and Charlie 
Hestand, has recently been 
elected assistant treasurer of 
the Bank of Bethesda in 
Bethesda, Md. 

Mrs. Dow has been with 
that bank several years, and 
was manager of its Aspen Hill 
Branch the past two years. 

The former Charlotte Hes-
tand, she attended Dimmitt 
schools and graduated in 
1959. After high school she 
attended Lubbock Christian 
College. 

and Lynn Schulte and Mayor Elmer Youts. Back row from left 
are Shirley Hall, Louie Wethington, Leonard Schulte, Rose 
Acker, Georgie Kleman, Myrtle Shelly, Nellie Shelton, Florine 
Brockman, Alan Newman, Carolyn Jones and Don Price. 

LYNN AND JIMMIE SCHULTE, owners of The Shoe Tree, cut 
the ribbon during ceremonies Friday morning which kicked off 
a two-day grand opening. The Shoe Tree is located in Ye Olde 
Inn in the former Nellie Jane's location. Pictured at the ribbon 
are Jerry Marvin, Chamber of Commerce president; Jimmie 

Nursing home operation 

in Dimmitt is explained 

TGSP elects 	FFA officers 
Gilbreath to 	attend meeting 
term on board in Plainview 

FARMER'S 

SUPPLY CO. 
THE FINEST IN 

Minneapolis-Morme 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO 

REPAIR 

Building 

Material for 

Every purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM 
BARTLM _CO. 

	• 

      

   

NAYS 
IMPLEMENT 

CO. 

 

   

INTERNATIONAL 
AGRICULTURAL 
EQUIPMENT 

 

    

     

      

      

John Gilbreath, who farms 
southeast of Dimmitt, has 
been elected to the Texas 
Grain Sorghum Producers 
board by vote of fellow pro-
ducers in a 29-county area. 

Also named to the board 
were Dennis Anthony of Fri-
ona, Steve Lee of Hale Center 
and Albert Scheele of Lock-
ney. They will serve a six-
year term. 

Texas GSP board works to 
solve production problems for 
sorghum growers, develop 
new markets for the grain and 
provide information on grain 
marketing. 

private rooms are available to 
those who want them, rather 
than semi-private rooms as 
permitted by the license. 

Some of the patients are 
ambulatory and quite active, 
while others are in terminal 
stages of illness, she said, 
and length of stay ranges 
from "a few hours to the 11 
years the nursing home has 
been in operation here." 

Mrs. Gilliland, introduced 
by Cliff Lewis, answered 
questions about accommoda-
tions and charges. 

Guests at the lunch in-
cluded Lisa Davis and Terry 
Mixson of the Dimmitt High 
School Key Club and Rev. Al-
bert Fuytinck of Odessa. 

The Dimmitt FFA officers 
attended a leadership con-
ference in Plainview Sept. 19 
at Plainview High School. 

Those attending the meet-
ing were Danny Underwood, 
Jerri Ka Clark, Laura Arm-
strong, Quint Waggoner and 
Jeri Mann. Jerry Roberts, 
treasurer of the Plainview 
District, also attended. 

The leadership conference 
was conducted by the district 
officers and David Ratton, 
state vice-president of Boys 
Ranch, assisted. 

The conference consisted of 
instruction in leadership and 
methods of meeting people. 

"With the school year get-
ting well underway, we are 
looking forward to a busy and 
successful year," Jeri Mann, 
reporter, said. 

SPS announces 
staff addition 

Life in a nursing home is 
not necessarily the depressing 
experience many people 
dread, Dimmitt Kiwanians 
were told Monday by Dolores 
Gilliland, administrator of 
South Hills Manor here, as 
she spoke at the Kiwanis Club 
lunch. 

"It's more pleasant for the 
patients than most people 
think," she said, "because 
most of them appreciate being 
relieved of responsibility, 
worry and daily duties in a 
protected situation. And our 
first goal is to maintain a 
homelike atmosphere. 

South Hills Manor is larger 
than most Dimmitt residents 
realize, the administrator ex-
plained, with an average of 75 
to 90 patients in residence 
and a payroll of 50 persons. 
An average of 15 to 20 staff 
members are always on duty, 
she added. 

The facility is licensed to 
care for 118 persons, but does 
not house that many because 

WHEN buying life insur-
ance, consider the "waiver-
of-premium" option which 
frees you from paying your 
annual premium if you be-
come disabled. 

COW POKES By Ace Reid 

Berl Springer, president 
and chief operating officer of 
Southwestern Public Service 
Company, has announced the 
appointment of Marshall 
Pharr as manager of govern-
mental relations for the el-
ectric company. 

Commenting on the addi-
tion of Pharr to the public 
affairs staff at SPS, Springer 
said, "We are very pleased to 
have a man of Pharr's ex-
perience and background. We 
feel he will be able to provide 
the management of South-
western additional insight in 
our relationships with gov-
ernment at all levels." 

Pharr has been serving as 
an administrative assistant to 
United States Congressman 
Kent Hance for the past year. 
He is a native of Lubbock and 
a graduate of Texas Tech Un-
iversity where he earned a 
bachelor of business admin-
istration degree in 1955. 

Before joining Congress-
man Hance, Pharr served as 
the city manager of Plainview 
for 15 years. Prior to that he 
was the city manager at An-
drews and an administrative 
intern for the City of Lubbock. 

THE circumference of the 
earth is 42 miles greater 
around the equator than it is 
around the poles. 

Drive Prienary the Tees WaY 
9-23 

o A 6 ?c ID 

You are in a heck of a shape Jake. 
You're suffering from BO, bad breath 

and ring around the collar. CABLE TV 

_BETTER PICTURE, 
MORE STATIONS! 
A Cable hook-up 

makes TV pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

EL Bunt of 9tundy Setakt 

DIMMITT 

TV CABLE CO. 

C NO INSTALLATION 

CHARGE 

Phone 647-2364 
MEMIER Of FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 



LADY 

VENUS 
The Aloe Vera plant is 
the base for our cos-
metic, hair-care and 
health prpducts. Cali met 

for a free Skin - Care 
Clinic in your home or' 
mine. 
BONNIE KENWORTHY 

647-3397 

A Girls in Action recogni-
tion service was held Sunday 
night during the worship ser-
vice. Candlelighters were 
Misty Ott and Kristie Owens. 
Terrie Carson brought the 
special music. Those receiv-
ing Badge I were Karla Sad-
ler, Mecca Sauseda, Shannon 
Ott and Melody Sadler. Those 
receiving Badge II were Sha-
ron Bradley, Chanin Ross and 
Cinnamon Cox. A reception in 
fellowship hall followed the 
service and the girls' work 
was on display. • 

A new daughter was born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Wag- 

I 

AMY 

We're still 

going strong 

until Oct. 12 

with our 

CLEARANCE SALE 
of the CENTURY 

Our factory-authorized Clearance Sale of the Century has been a big success. A 

lot of happy people have saved a lot of money on new 1979 Fords. 

We still have a good selection left, and we need to get them all sold by Oct. 12. 
They're going fast, as people discover our drastically reduced prices on all 

models. 

There's no reason to wait—you'll never again find new Fords priced lower. This 
is truly the biggest clearance sale in our history, and in the history of the Ford 

Motor Co. 

If you want to get a new 1979 Ford at a big, big discount, hurry! 

Stan Byrnes 

andra 
Savings 
Center 

In harden Shopping Center 	 Phone 647-3158 
NEW STORE HOURS Mon. thru Fri. 9 A.M. to 7 P.M. 

Prices Good Sept. 27 Thru Oct. 3 Set 9 A.M. to 8 P.M. 
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Nazareth's member named for tax board 
in the old-style fixtures costs 
$500 a year. 

—Decided to put a 1963 
Chevrolet 54-passenger school 
bus up for sale by bid. 

—Approved three students 
who attend the Area Voca-
tional School in Tulia to drive 
the bus each day. Greg Bir-
kenfeld will be the regular 
driver with Carey Acker and 
Dale Hoelting as alternates. 

—Approved School Supt. 
Johnny Mason to represent 
the board at a school con-
ference in San Antonio Oct. 
5-7. 

—Adopted a policy which 

prohibits the school lunch-
room buying food for resale. 
Employees and citizens may 
not purchase food from the 
lunchroom directly or indirect-
ly. 

—Chose Craig Agency to 
write insurance on school 
buses and band instruments. 
This agency handles other in-
surance coverage for the 
N1SD. 

—Amended the school cal-
endar to make Nov. 1 a teach-
er in-service day, and cancel 
the in-service day scheduled 
for Jan. 2. 

—Formally approved an 
employee complaint proce-
dure, already in effect in the 
school, to comply with federal 
regulations that such approval 
must be filed with the PESO 
Regional Service Center. 

year. 
In other action, the board: 
—Sent notes of apprecia-

tion to the Dimmitt ISD board 
of trustees for donation of a 
football scoreboard for Naz-
areth's football field, and to 
Big T Pump Co. for help in 
removing the board from its 
former location at Dimmitt.

—Voted to replace present 
gymnasium lights with new 
vapor-type fixtures which will 
increase light power in the 
gym, use less energy and cost 
less for repair and replace-
ment. Members were told 
that bulb replacement alone 

What's cooking at the school 

r 
THE DIMMITT YOUNG HOMEMAKERS will be guided this 
year by these officers. Seated, from left, are Bobbi Wooten, 
president; Karen Robertson, first vice-president; Doricell 
Davis, second vice-president; Diane Townsend, secretary; 

Rhenea Webb, treasurer; and Jeannie Sammann, parliamen-
tarian. Not pictured is Susan Merritt, reporter. The Dimmitt 
chapter was runner-up for Outstanding Chapter honors at the 
recent Area I Convention. 

Sunnysicki 

1 CASTRO 
II  CO-OP GIN 

11 

Pistol match slated 
A pistol match will be held 

at 10 a.m. Saturday at the 
police firing range at the Dim-
mitt Airport. 

Competition is open to ci-
vilians. Those attending must 
bring their own weapons and 
ammo. 

For more information con-
tact any law enforcement of-
ficer. 

The public is invited to at-
tend. 

GA's hold special service 
714 S. Hwy. 38S 

Dimmitt, Texas. 

Ph. 647-3546 

Moving to comply with a 
new state law providing for a 
county-wide tax appraisal 
board, the Nazareth Indepen-
dent School District board last 
Wednesday appointed Cyril 
Brockman to represent Naz-
areth school district, city and 
community on a five-man 
board. 

The new law is aimed at 
equitable appraisal for taxes 
of all property in city and 
school district taxing entities. 
The board is empowered to 
appoint a county board of 
equalization. 

The appraisal board will 
include a member from the 
Nazareth area, one from the 
Hart area, one from the City 
of Dimmitt and one each from 
Precincts 2 and 3. The county 
has an option of delaying its 
participation in the appraisal 
district until 1981, and Castro 
County commissioners voted 
recently to exercise that op-
tion. 

At last week's meeting the 
Nazareth school board also 
voted small wage increases to 
all personnel paid by the 
hour, effective Sept. 1, and 
made wage adjustments to 
comply with minimum wage 
requirements. A proposal to 
increase school bus drivers' 
salaries was tabled until next 

Here are the lunch menus 
for Dimmitt schools for the 
week of Oct. 1-5. 

MONDAY — Hamburgers, 
buttered corn, cake, milk. 

TUESDAY — Smoked sau-
sage, creamed potatoes, 
green beans, gelatin, rolls, 
butter, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Beef 
stew, pineapple slices, cin-
namon rolls, corn bread, 
crackers, milk. 

THURSDAY — Lasagna, 
tossed salad, blackeyed peas, 
pudding, rolls, butter, milk. 

FRIDAY — Sandwich tray, 
French fries, peanut clusters, 

By TEENY BOWDEN !Mt.:411%w  .01• ••• 
JP rat 

q1Q 
* 

fl 171 

G;51  
UltraRick. -1/1traRich_ intraRich_ 

go,  
VANiSil 

with relatives in Fort Worth 
Wednesday evening. 

Dara Loudder has been el-
ected reporter for the Spring-
lake-Earth junior high Honor 
Society. 

Mrs. Cliff Brown and the 
Uppitts had charge of the 
children's sermon Sunday 
morning. Fifteen children at-
tended. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Phelan 
and Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 
Phelan of Weatherford visited 
Friday through Saturday 
nights with Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Phelan. 

Paul Nash, a former resi-
dent of the community, and 
Patsy Lavender, both of Azle, 
visited Sunday afternoon with 
his niece, Mr. and Mrs. E. R. 
Sadler. 

• 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Bern-
hardt, Joe, John and Shane 
from Fort Worth spent Sat-
urday night with Mrs. David 
Sadler, Melody and Karla. 

Mrs. Mary Shultz spent the 
day Tuesday with her _neph-
ew, Mr. and Mrs. ...E. R. 
Sadler. 

The WMU Council met 
Thursday morning for the first 
phase of annual planning with 

Toilet Bowl Cleaner 

VANISH 
CRYSTALS 

Reg. 	C $,13 34 oz. 
Can 

bttlutsi fonni.X> 
Shampoo 

"1-14AZ 10  07, raw 

L'OREAL 	‘k 	e 5181\e°u\s.s\I 

Shampoo 
Gouty tatrfluio 

16  it at 

	Shampoo 
Q5.3°,.. I'd 'Onto 

15R 01 

Oils HAI Q 	 (WTI t 

*Oily 'Normal 

Rich 
11,00>ktio... 

*Gentle 
SHAMPOO 

Ultra 

Litt 
sr  $ 1 69 16 oz. 

Reg. 

Blue Automatic 

goner in Central Plains Gen-
eral Hospital in Plainview 
Monday morning. She weigh-
ed 7 pounds, 121/2  ounces and 
was named Kodi Michelle. 
They were dismissed Thurs-
day but will stay in Dimmitt a 
few days with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Hasley. 
Stacy and Jana have been 
staying with their grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. Paul 
Waggoner. 

Mrs. L. B. Bowden met 
with the Castro County His-
torical Commission and Judy 
Cotton of Lubbock Tuesday, 
and with other volunteer 
workers. Mrs. Bowden and 
Mrs. Cotton were guests of 
the Lions Club at noon where 
Mrs. Cotton was the guest 
speaker. 

Rev, Raymond Jones at-
tended the Sunday School Re-
gional Convention in Plain-
view Tuesday. 

R. V. Bills and another man 
killed two rattlesnakes this 
week on the Larry Bills farm. 
One had nine rattlers and a 
button and the other six and a 
button. • 

VANISH 

While Supply 	"Red Ryder" Sunbeam "Crocker" 

FRYPAN 
Removable 4 Qt. ceramic vessel adds slow 
cooking versatility to electric frypan use. 

Mrs. Raymond Jones re-
turned home from her visit Lasts 

Reg. $24" 

B.B. GUN 

Told Bowl Cleaner 

Reg. 99C 12 oz. 
$121 	 BtI. 

$1 999 	By Dais 

$33" Reg. $419" 

Gibson Spray Enamel 

PAINT 

$129  
13 oz. 

Reg. $159  
Dickies 

Short Sleeve 

COVERALLS 
Reg. $1399 	While 

Supply 
Lasts 

ALL LIFE PRESERVERS 

$500  in 
Stock-

OFF 
REG. PRICE 

Nteiticil RE T 
it Campho- 

Phemque 
LIQUID 

14.1111-11EUMIC 

ANTISEPTIC 
IDA sons 

culs-euas 

SOUS 0,110514/141,1 

Bedroom BouQuel 

Bedroom Bouquet 
Solid Air Freshener 

Reg. 6T 
6 oz. Size 53` 

CAMPHO- 
PHENIQUE 

Liquid Antiseptic for 
Sores-Cuts and Burns 

4 oz. Btl. 
Reg $2.9 

Now 

Super Odor Killer 

RENUZIT Campho- 
Phengie Solid Air Deodorizer LIQUID 

; 

COS WO 
nista WO 

stallet 
CaCt }las 

Ii  

eimait 
;wag 

odocknit  Reg. 67' 
6 oz. Size 

II Fragrances 53` 
- • .4m 	t. 

Conair 
Pro Style 7 

master charge 
mmmmmm cat.. 

HAIR 
DRYER 

2 Speed 4 Heat Settings 
1250 Watt 
REG. %air 

$3919  
see THE omumuan' man at... 

STAN BYRNES FORD, INC. 
N. Hwy. 311.3 	 647-2115 

We never met a deal we couldn't beat 

Mrs. Raymond Jones in 
charge. She will continue to 
be the director. Mrs. E. R. 
Sadler will serve again as BW 
president, Mrs. Carl Dean 
Carson BYW president, Mrs. 
Terry Guy Acteen director-
leader, Mrs. Hershel Wilson 
GA director-leader, Terrie 
Carson GA leader and Mrs. 
Lee Bradley mission director. 
Other members of the council 
are Mrs. Roy Phelan, cen-
tennial chairman, Mrs. Mil-
burn Haydon, mission action 
director, Mrs. David Sadler 
creative arts director and 
Mrs. L. B. Bowden secre-
tary-treasurer. • 

Baptist Women met for an-
nual planning Monday mor-
ning with Mrs. E. R. Sadler in 
charge. 

Daneen Wilson was home 
from Tech for Saturday and 
Sunday and attended the ser-
vices Sunday with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Hershel 
Wilson. 

Susan Sadler was home 
from Tech Sunday afternoon 
and attended the church ser-
vices Sunday night with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gale 
Sadler. 

[Delayed from last week] 
The Baptist Young Women 

honored the Baptist Women 
with a brunch at the church 
recently, with 11 present. 

Rev. Raymond Jones and 
Hershel Wilson attended the 
Brotherhood Training Session 
at the Lubbock Area Center. 
Wilson took the course for 
Baptist Men, and Rev. Jones 
taught the RA Crusader 
course. 

Mrs. Raymond Jones visit-
ed in Fort Worth with her 
mother, Mrs. Mae Etta 
Watts, and her sister and 
brother-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Allen and family, who 
are music missionaries to 
Zambia, home on furlough 
and living near Fort Worth. 

Gary Lillet was dismissed 
from Central General Hospital 
in Plainview after several 
days of tests. • 

Mrs. Jess Lilley called from 
Stephenville to ask about get-
ting their stories in for the 
Castro County History Book. 
She and her three daughters 
are planning to submit stor-
ies. We need more people this 
dedicated. 

Hershel Wilson and Jessica 
Wilson were honored with ice 
cream and cake to celebrate 
their birthdays. Friends and 
relatives from Ropesville, 
Wolfforth, Olton and the Sun-
nyside area helped them with 
the celebration. 

Mrs. Lillian Carson and 
Greg George of Dimmitt were 
honored with a supper at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Bradley. Resa Carson was 
home from Lubbock to help 
with the celebration, along 
with Mr. and Mrs. Carl Dean 
Carson and Deakon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Ott of 
Avinger came to help with the 
corn harvest and visit with 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Ott and 
girls and other relatives and 
friends. 

• 

Lonnie Wilson was honored 
with a birthday supper in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Phillip 
Jones. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Brown 
and Lynn, Tammy and Rhon-
da Ross, Carrie and Stacy 
Sadler and Ginny and Anne 
Guy attended a puppet train-
ing seminar in Brownfield. 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin Lefesere 
met them there and they had 
lunch together. 



Diamond Shamrock 

•Drip Oil 	Motor Oil 

'Diesel 	'Gasoline 
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Dimmitt Business and Industrial &view 
you 

provide the problem 

ask us about 

your 

FREE TRIP 
to 

HAWAII 
for 1980! 

Bruegel & Sons, Inc. The First State Bank 
of Dimmitt 	647.4151 

oq The time to think about retirement 
is when you're still young. while 
there's still time to make adequate 
plans for the extra funds you'll 
need. Farm Bureau insurance can 
build funds for your retirement 
while it's protecting your family. 
Call your local Farm Bureau insur-
ance agent today—he's a good 
man to know! 

Jack W. Flynt, CLU 
Agency Manager 

Castro County Farm Bureau 

Phone 647-3420 

WHAT'S YOUR PRODUCTION TEAM 

LOOK LIKE THIS YEAR? 

Why not join the Superfield Champions? 

We have an offensive line of fortified dry bulk 
blended fertilizers 

The backfield is lead by seasoned veterans of the field-
high scoring coop seeds 

Reliable, aggresive herbicides arid pesticides are the 
toughest defense in the league. 

BE A WINNER-JOIN THE CROP PRODUCTION 
TEAM OF DIMMITT AGRI INDUSTRIES! 

Dimmitt Agri Industries 
Box 728 	 647-2141 

Our new Summitt Engine Lathe makes 
it possible for John Wait to do nearly 
any lathe work that needs to be done 
in our area. 
If you know anything about lathes, 
you'll appreciate these features: 

It has a 28-inch swing with 80-inch 
centers. A four-inch bore in the spindle. 
It has a precision taper attachment. 
It converts to US or metric 
measurements. 
It will thread full joints up to half-
inch pipe—either US threads or metric 
threads. 

East Highway 86 

With an RPM range of 22 to 1,500, it 
can drill or lathe to exacting precision 
when needed, or for fast turnout when 
needed. 

If you DON'T know anything about 
lathes, you only need to remember 
this: 
Whatever lathe work you need done, 
we can do it at Dimmitt Welding & 
Electric. 
Of course, that also holds true for 
multi-metal welding, millwright work, 
industrial electrical work, and all types 
of metal machining. 

647-3128 

FOR THE MOST ECONOMICAL 
FARM AND RANCH FUELS 

YOU CAN DEPEND ON 

We also stock a full line of 

Amalie Motor Oil 

LP Gas and Butane 
Carburetor 

  	Installation and Repair 

Chem-Tex Farm Supply 
Hwy. 86 East 	 647-3551 

Is your 

elevator 

busted? 

Feeling lower than a bootpit, huh? Well, quit 
worrying—just call us and we'll fix it for you. 

We do elevator repair, including complete 
electrical and millwright work. We also handle 
all the bearings, screw-conveyor parts, pulleys 
and belts that your elevator will need to put it in 
top working shape again for the harvest. 

Dimmitt Welding & Electric 
E. Hwy. 86 	 647.3128 

Do 

DIMMITT WELDING & ELECTRIC 
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MEMBER 

we mg 
supply the solution 

Medical expenses can pop up just when your 
finances are lowest. Should you need extra cash in a 
hurry to pay those bills, see us. We'll arrange a 
loan with convenient terms. 

With this new engine lathe, we can machine 
anything from a small trailer spindle to the 
drive shaft of a Mack truck. 

Now Only $90 Each 

BB 
go 

P Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 

OO 

O 
MACKLENBURG-DUNCAN 
weather stripping and caulking—
silicone, latex and butyl rubber 

Hanes 
UNDERWEAR 

Hanes" Men's 

BRIEFS & 

T-SHIRTS 

yp 

Hones makes you feel good oil 

under. 100°0 cotton underweor 
that is soft C./ durable. Re-

inforced or stress points. 
Sizes 28-44 Brief. S-M-L-
XL T-shirt. White only.  

BRIEF 

3 / 5.79 

T-SHIRT 

3/6.49 

Two-Window Storm Door 
11/4  inches thick, aluminum finish, 
two windows with tempered glass. 
2-8 x 6-8 and 3-0 x 6-8, right or left 
opening. 

Now Only $795°  Each 

Full-View Storm Door 
11/4  inches thick, bronze or white 

uy 	finish. All tempered glass. 2-8 x 6-8 
go 	and 3-0 x 6-8, right or left opening. 
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00
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Black s Decker 

CORDLESS VAC 

Great for quick clean-ups after spills DUST-
BUSTER'S storage unit is a charging bracket. 
Mounts on any wall near electrical outlet. 
Keeps DUSTBUSTER within easy reach. always 

ready to use 

24" 

KILLINGSWORTH 
Builders Supply 

S. Hwy. 385 	647-3141 

.77.77.7.,:::7,.',E11/J..,,,n1/1171,1711111111116111MM.,, 

Mount the John Deere 283 Stripper on a 4030. 
4230. or 4430 Tractor with a Sound-Gard body 
and you have the ultimate in cotton-harvesting 
speed. efficiency, and comfort You can scoot 
down the rows at speeds up to 7 mph You 
can work in a quiet. comfortable environment 
that just naturally makes each day seem a 
lot shorter 

Stop in soon and get complete 
information on the John Deere 283 
Stripper—the stripper that makes 
harvesting more comfortable 

US Equipment Co. 647-3324 

i\kss  0 	LIFE 	E04.  

0\1‘<c  INSURANCE 'Nib 
SEE BILL SNIDER 

Your friendly Farmers Group Agent 
at 

Snider Insurance Agency 
647-4652 (Office) 
	

Bill Snider 
647-3502 (Home) 
	

212 W. Bedford 

F AVMS 

14' GROUP fib. ,,,1014N °EIRE 



M&W CONTINUOUS 
FLOW GRAIN DRYER 

CONTINUOUS FLOW 
CONCURRENT HEAT 
• GRAIN FLOW 
BUILT-IN VAPORIZER 
AUTOMATIC BIN 
SWITCH 
MODULATING 
BURNER CONTROL 
UNLOADING AUGER 
PRE-HEAT HOLDING 
HOPPER 

HEAVY DUTY 
TRANSPORT EQUIP 
PT O. OR ELECTRIC 
NATURAL OAS, LP 
OR COMBINATION 
SIMPLE CONTROLS 

PORTABLE 
OUTSTANDING 
CAPACITY 
GREATER VOLUME 
OF AIR FLOW 
QUIET SQUIRREL 
CAGE FAN 
SUPERB GRAIN 
QUALITY 

The •SCIA is • Confine:us Flow Grain Dent providing 1M wanly, reliability and predslon of dpafiago 
lot Ule OttiCiehl end KOndelliCal COnditionWity of grain TM NOA Is • pra01140 rivicenne WOO sip 

NORIO ay-in and dayOul. meson Mtn 0011WOni In any Yowl of ....may. with unerring ithowywy It wii 
Gen•fatit venting profits with Its high Noway. unique Crying ability and penny-FrInchins economy oi 
slorillie& CAC NI the UM Of (alum and SPOCIIICSIOnit and Monne en, more and more Isrmers and 

eleyales operators tfuoustoul Pm country rely upon Its trysted awns of MAW to produce • superb manly oi 

Grain at en economy or price 

Our M&W 450 Grain Dryers are Being Sold At 

CLOSE OUT PRICES 
It will pay you to take advantage of this bargain 

South Nazareth Farm Store 
South Highway Hifi Nazareth 	 Phone 045-2225 

450A 

GET IN THE ACTION! 

PP '79 

Stan Byrnes Ford, Inc. 
N. Hwy 385 	 647-2115 

COMPETE SATURDAY 
IN PUNT, PASS & KICK 

Its's free, and open to boys and girls ages 8 to 13. 
Compete with others in your own age group. If you will 
be 8 to 13 years old as of Dec. 31, 1979, you're 
eligible. Competition will be in six age divisions, and 
trophies will be awarded for first, second and third 
place in each division. If you win, you'll advance to 
the District Punt, Pass & Kick Contest in Amarillo Oct. 
6. You could even compete in the PP&K National 
Championship Finals held at Super Bowl XIV to be 
played Jan. 20, 1980. in Pasadena, California. 

Register at your school. 
Registration is simple. Just pick up a form at your 
school. Stan Byrnes Ford, Inc., has distributed forms to 
Richardson Elementary School, Dimmitt Middle School, 
Hart Elementary School and Nazareth Elementary 
School. After you register, come by Stan Byrnes Ford, 
Inc., for a free PP&K Tips Book. It has pointers from 
the pros and is designed to prepare you for Punt, Pass 
& Kick. 

Contest will be Saturday at 2 at Bobcat Stadium. 
The 1979 Castro County Punt, Pass & Kick Contest will 
be held at 2 p.m. this Saturday at Bobcat Stadium in 
Dimmitt. We hope to see you there. Stan Byrnes Ford, 
Inc., is proud to conduct PP&K here again this year, 
and to sponsor our county winners in higher levels of 
competition. Good luck! 

Thursday, September 27, 1979 
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Dimmitt Frosh 

top Hart's JV Week's schedule 

7th graders 

score at end 
of thriller Dimmitt's freshmen hiked 

their season football record to 
2-0 last Thursday with an 18-6 
victory over the Hart junior 
varsity. 

Turnovers spelled the dif-
ference as Andrew Sepeda 
and Bill Grosz recovered Hart 
fumbles to set up Dimmitt 
touchdowns, and Johnny Gon-
zales made a key interception 
to stop a Hart drive. 

Dimmitt opened the scoring 
in the first quarter when Fer-
min Gonzales returned a Hart 
punt 65 yards for a TD. In the 
second period, quarterback 
Ron Rickenbrode passed to 
Jeff Watts on a 20-yard scor-
ing play that gave Dimmitt a 
12-0 halftime lead. 

Dimmitt stretched its lead 
to 18-0 in the third period 
when Ruben Cases broke 
loose on a 35-yard scoring 
run. 

A scoreless tie for Dimmitt 
and Plainview seventh grad-
ers was dissolved in the last 
minute and a half last Thurs-
day when Dimmitt's Michael 
Love ran a 12-yard touchdown 
around the left end for a 6-0 
win. 

Dimmitt had gained 10 
yards on the same sweep in 
the previous play to overcome 
a second-and-20 situation. 
The score came with 1:30 re-
maining in the game. 

The Dimmitt defense, 
sparked by Jay Sears and 
Bobby Nino, held Plainview in 
check throughout the game. 

"Defense improved tre-
mendously in this game," 
Coach Pruit said, "and the of-
fense also looked better." He 
cited the offensive play of 
Love and Nathan Nelson. 

WILLIAM Howard Taft tip-
ped the scales at 353 pounds 
while in the White House. t\- 

JOHN STEFFENS, Nazareth quarterback, finds himself airborne as he gains 
seven yards against Hart in Friday night's intra-county shootout at Nazareth. 
Identifiable Longhorns in on the leather-popping play are Jorge Barretero [22) 
and Isaias Ponce [7]; other Longhorns coming up are Melvin Washington [41], 
Marlin Marble (74] and Chad Black [31]. Nazareth blacker& are Bryan 

Huseman [30], Dwayne Acker [44] and Gary Book [85]. This was the last 
running play in a Swift drive that started with a touchdown-saving fumble 
recovery at the Nazareth 2. Steffens came up two yards shy of a first down, 
forcing a Nazareth punt from the 32. The Swifts won the fierce defensive 
battle, 7-0. 

DIMMITT 
TODAY —JV vs. Olton, 

here at 7 p.m., Freshmen vs. 
Olton, here at 5 p.m. 

FRIDAY — Open. 
THURSDAY—JV vs. Tulia, 

there at 7 p.m., Freshmen vs. 
Tulia, there at 5 p.m., 7th vs. 
Tulia, here at 5 p.m., 8th vs. 
Tulia, here at 6 p.m. 

NAZARETH 
TODAY-7th, 8th and JV 

vs. Anton, here at 5 p.m. 
FRIDAY—Swifts vs. White-

face, there at 8 p.m. 
TUESDAY-7th and 8th vs. 

Dimmitt, there at 5 p.m. 
THURSDAY—JV vs. Mot-

ley Co., here at 6 p.m. 
HART 

TODAY-7th and 8th vs. 
Petersburg, there at 5 p.m., 
JV vs. Petersburg, there at 7 
p.m. 

FRIDAY — Longhorns vs. 
Petersburg, here at 8 p.m. 

THURSDAY-7th and 8th 
vs. Silverton, there at 5 p.m., 
JV vs. Silverton, there at 7 
p.m. 

Hart retaliated with a 
fourth-quarter drive capped 
by a four-yard touchdown 
plunge to make the final score 
18-6. 

"I thought our offensive 
line was outstanding, and our 
whole defense played well," 
Dimmitt Coach John Thomas 
said. 

REST TAKE A 
ARS  BREAK 

* 
	

* 
	

* 
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Swifts upset Longhorns, 
ginning of the fourth quarter, 
the two teams' defenses dom-
inated the game. 

In the fourth quarter, the 
Horns penetrated to the 6-
yard line, but the Swift de-
fense forced them to give up 
the ball on the 9 four plays 
later. 

Hart was denied another 
scoring opportunity by the 
Swifts when cornerback Hugh 

Nazareth 

Hill receives award 
By VIRGIE GERBER party for Tonya Huseman at 

the Dennis Heiman home. 
Dolores, Ramona and Dar-

rin Heiman and Mrs. Meta 
Stork enjoyed a birthday sup-
-per .for Florene Leinen in 
Dimmitt Satiiklay evening. 

"By a....vote of 259-6, 
the Swedish Parliament has a new law, effective July 
1, absolutely prohibiting a parent from striking a child 
anywhere, anytime, for any reason. Parents may not 
read the child's mail, nor prohibit him from reading 
pornography, send a child to bed without supper, re-
strict television rights or any other humiliating 
experiences." (Taken from "Faith for the Family, 
July/Aug. 79 The Torch,) 

Paid for by Pro Family Forum 
wi.meiereic imirmme• 
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The Nazareth Swifts, 18-
point underdogs by the Harris 
Rating System, used a bal-
anced defense and a consis-
tent running game to upset 
the Hart Longhorns, 7-0, at 
Swift Stadium Friday night. 

The Swifts relied on good 
running from Bryan Huseman 
(19 carries for 85 yards) and a 
defense led by Dale Wilhelm 
110 tackles) as they chalked 

up their first win of 1979. 
The Swifts began the 

game's only scoring drive at 
the Hart 42 in the opening 
quarter. 

The drive was aided by two 
crucial penalties: On fourth 
and 11 from Hart's 33, Naz-
areth's Calvin Schulte punted, 
but two Hart defenders rush-
ed in and knocked him down. 
The roughing-the-kicker pen-
alty gave the Swifts excellent 
field position on Hart's 18-
yard line. 

After two running plays 
gained nothing, quarterback 
John Steffens dropped back to 
pass to end Gary Book. Book 
was interfered with by two 
Hart defenders, giving the 
Swifts first and goal on the 2. 

On the next play, Huseman 
got the handoff from Steffens 
and hit paydirt. After the 
Huseman kick, the Swifts led 
7-0 with 4:30 left in the first 
stanza. 

From there until the be- 

For All Of Your 

PLUMBING 
NEEDS 

Call 

DEAN KIRBY 
647-4594 Dimmitt 
605 W. Cleveland 

Tex.% Office Of TraFfit Safety 

By CHRIS ALBRACHT Wilhelm picked off a Derek 
Rich pass on second and 10 
from the Swift 38 with 2:12 
left in the game. The Swifts 
then punted and with six sec-
onds left, the Longhorns had 
their last chance to win. 

With the ball on the Naz-
areth 35, Rich dropped back 
and found fullback Melvin 
Washington at the 10-yard 
line, but Washington couldn't 

7-0 
hang onto it. 

"I was very proud of our 
defense, for the goal-line 
stands they had," said NHS 
Coach Eddie Hooper. "I was 
satisfied by our passing and 
rushing defense. 

"Offensively, we were in a 
hole in the second half, al-
though we were annoyed by 
fumbles 14) and penalties 16 
for 45 yards) that cost us field 
position," Hooper added. 

* 
GAME AT A GLANCE 

Hart 	 Nazareth 
5 	First Downs 	11 
106 Net Yards Rushing 131 
4 	Net Yards Passing 	14 
110 Total Yards Gained 145 
1/4 	Passes Att/Comp 1/6 
0 	Passes Intercepted By 1 
4/27.0 Punts/Avg 6/33.0 
3 Opp. Fumbles Recovered 6 
9/86 Penalties/Yards 6/45 

For the best return on your crop and investment - . . 

BRING YOUR  GRAIN 
TO YOUR ELEVATORS 

CHECK THESE ADVANTAGES 

1 CONVENIENT FACILITIES 
Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc., has seven handling facilities for corn, conveniently located to serve 
the needs of the entire county. You can take your corn to the location most convenient for you. 

• NORTH POINT [6 north of Dimmitt] 

• TAM ANNE t9 west of Dimmitt] 

• FLAGG 115 southwest of Dimmitt] 

• MAIN FACILITY, DIMMITT 

• SOUTH ELEVATOR, DIMMITT 

• NAZARETH 

• WEST FACILITY, DIMMITT 

Charley and Beverly Hill 
spent several days at College 
Station where Charley was 
presented a Certificate of 
Merit for his contribution in 
administering ASCS programs 
in Castro County. On their 
way home they stopped in 
Cameron and visited with 
Larry and Donna Charanza 
and sons, Kris Ryan and 
Bryan. 

Mrs. Doyle Kleman flew to 
College Station Sunday for a 
one week training school on 
the various programs admin-
istered by the ASCS office 
where she is employed. 

Marsha, Ashley and Court-
ney Hoelting have been visit-
ing here with their grandpar-
ents, the Ray Schultes, while 
their parents, Bill and Bernita 
Hoelting of Odessa, attended 
a convention in Arizona. 

Mrs. Louise Braddock spent 
the week in Odessa with her 
grandchildren, Natalie and 
Jenny Gerber, while their par-
ents, Gene and Susie, attend-
ed a directors convention in 
Toronto, Canada. 

Mrs. George Book Sr. has 
been transferred from an Am-
arillo hospital to the Tulia 
hospital. She is recovering 
from surgery. 

Mrs. Leonard Conrad is still 
in St. Anthony's Hospital, 
where she had surgery. 

Regina Steffens and family, 
the Bud Steffens family and 
Mrs. Sybil Steffens, attended 
the 90th birthday celebration 
of Bud's father in Slaton on 
Sunday. 

Virgil and Rosalie Davis of 
Los Altos, Calif. are the new 
parents of a son named Craig 
Martin. Florence and Lucille 
Schacher, grandparents of the 
boy, are visiting with their 
daughter Rosalie and family. 

Sister Jane Brockman of 
Little Rock, Ark., Mrs. Mar-
tha Woods of Washington, 
D.C. and Mrs. Mattie Enders 
of Muenster have been here 
the past week visiting with 
the Brockman families. 

STORAGE SPACE 
Dimmitt Agri Industries has 6,419,000 bushels of Federally licensed and bonded 

warehouse space for your use. 

DRYING CAPACITY 
Our grain drying capacity of 16,750 bushels per hour compliments the 
complete grain handling facilities that are available to our customers. 

DIVERSIFIED MARKETS 
Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc., has access to a wide range of local, foreign and domestic markets. 
With these diversified markets, we can make sure that your corn MOVES at the best possible 
price. 

We will appreciate the opportunity to handle your grain. 

DIMMITT AGRI-INDUSTRIES 
Bill Clark, Manager 
	

Phone 647-2141 

Sister Generose Huseman 
of Fort Smith, Ark. has been 
here for a 10-day visit with 
her mother, Mrs. Katie Huse-
man. Sister DeChantel Hy-
land has also been here to 
visit. 

Sunday dinner guests of the 
Robert Husemans were Mrs. 
Faye Hicks of Amarillo, 
Maudie Wood of Van Nuys, 
Calif., Billy and Anna Lee of 
Tulia and Raymond, Kimmie 
and Amber Huseman. 

Mrs. Bert Huseman, Mrs. 
Meta Stork and Mrs. Easy 
Schulte attended a birthday 
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Hays Implement Co. 
is pleased to announce 

that 

Sonny Armstrong 
has joined our staff as 
a sales representative. 

• Please call on him anytime he 

'can be of service or assistance. 
0 	 

When you deal with 
Bruegel & Sons, Inc., 

you're the boss! 

We're ready to receive and 
handle your SUNFLOWERS 

CORN  
MILO 
SOYBEANS  

WHEAT SEED 
We've booked a lot of wheat seed so far, but all popular 

varieties are still available in good quantities. See us for 

the wheat seed you need. 

HAWAIIAN VACATION! 

Every scale ticket or bale number your receive from any 

Bruegel 8 Sons facility this harvest season will automatically 

give you a free chance for a Hawaiian vacation for two. 

One-week, all-expense-paid vacations for three couples 

will be awarded, with winners to be announced in January. 

Bruegel & Sons, Inc. 
"Serving the Rest Grainmen in the Nation" 

Money Market 

10.114% 
(Effective 9-27-79) 

6 Month 
SAVINGS CERTIFICATE 

Minimum Deposit $10,000® 

Earn A High Rate on a Short Term 
Basis. And Get More For Thar Money 

Federal Regulations prohibit the compounding of interest on Money Market 
Certificates. 

This does not apply on certificates described below. 

SAVINGS & CERTIFICATE 

TYPE OF 
ACCOUNT 

Pass Book 
90 Day 
1 Year Certificate 
2 1/2 Year Certificate 
4 Year Certificate 
6 Yew Certificate 
8 Year Certificate 

Year Money Mkt. CD 
6 Months Money Mkt. CD 

MINIMUM 
DEPOSIT 

5.00 
5.00 

1 ,000.00 
1 ,000 00 
1 ,000.00 
1 ,000,00 
1 ,000.00 
1 ,000.00 

10,000.00 

RATES 
EFFECTIVE 

ANNUAL RATE COMPOUNDED 
RATE 	 DAILY 

	

5.50 % 	 5.65 4 

	

5.75% 	 5.92% 

	

6.50% 	 6.72 % 

	

6.75% 	 6.98% 

	

7.50% 	 7.79% 

	

7.75% 	 8.06% 

	

8.00% 	 8.33% 
Rate On Request 
Rote On Request 

RATES NEGOTIABLE ON 100,000, OR MORI 
INTEREST COMPOUNDED DAILY — PAID QUARTERLY EXCEPT 6 MONTH MONEY MARKET CERT 

FEDERAL REGULATIONS REQUIRE A SUBSTANTIAL PENALTY FOR EARLY WITHDRAWAL 

OTHER OFFICES 
PLAI NV I EV/. 

2804 Olton Rd.  
293-2607 

TULIA 	HALE CENTER SILVERTON 

200 N. Maxwell 707 Main St. 	416 Main 

995-3521 	839-2446 	823-2056 

Either Way You Get More For Your Monet, 

Central Plains Savings dokto 
Association 	saysissa, 

Dimmitt, Texas 647-2118 
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UW tennis tourney 
winners announced 

8th grade smothers 
Plainview by 34-0 

Kay Keller second in ladies 
doubles. Darryle Frazier and 
Craig Potts were first in 
mixed doubles, the Larry 
Manbys second. 

Mrs. Clark and Mrs. Davis 
won the two top spots in 
ladies singles, Jerry Heller 
and Manby were first and 
second in mens singles. 

Plainview JV 
drops Dimmitt 

by Roy Tijerina, who ran 22 
yards of a 25-yard push. 
Dwight McDonald's pass to 
Brandon Cox was good for 2 
more points. 

Set up by a 25-yard punt 
return by Paul Flores, a gain 
of 25 more by Sammy Mendez 
accounted for the 6 points 
scored in the third frame. A 
pass from Scott Lane to Men-
dez failed for the extra tally. 

Richard Sauceda was cited 
for action on the offense, as 
well as Kenworthy and Brue-
gel, while Kennon Howell and 
Cox stood out on defense, 
Coach Durham said. 

Your chances 
of dying 
from a heart attack 
or stroke are 50-50. 

American Heart 4...mutton 

until Stewart had earned a first down at the Dimmitt 38. 
Stewart was the game's leading ground-gainer, and scored 
Dimmitt's only touchdown on a 41-yard run in the third period. 
The visitors from District 5-AA won the game, 21-6. 

OUTTA MY WAY!—Dimmitt tailback Jimmy Stewart stiff-
arms Tahoka's Tracy White out of the way as he turns the 
corner on a seven-yard run in the first quarter of the Bobcat-
Bulldog encounter here Friday night. Tahoka's Todd Brown 
[24] and Clifford Oages [26] eventually made the tackle, but not 

* 

Down 20-0 at the close of 
the first quarter, the Plain-
view White never came in 
sight of Dimmitt's eighth 
graders in a game here last 
Thursday, and was swamped 
34-0 by the time it was all 
over. 

Everybody on the home 
team "got to play quite a 
lot," Coach Jerry Durham 
said, and Dimmitt took it easy 
in the scoreless last quarter 
after adding 8 points in the 
second and 6 in the third to 
the initial outburst. 

Mark Bruegel made the 
first tally on a 20-yard run to 
climax a 65-yard drive, then 
staged his own 40-yard drive 
for another, while Timmy 
Kenworthy pushed over a 
yard for the remaining first-
quarter scoring to complete a 
20-yard Dimmitt effort. 

Kenworthy missed on PAT 
pass attempts to Simpson and 
Dennis Burnham, but made 2 
points on a run. 

The second quarter TD was Dogs outlast Cats, 27-6 

Dimmitt's Junior Varsity 
dropped its third game last 
Thursday, this time to Plain-
view by a 22-8 count. 

Plainview surged to a 14-0 
halftime lead before Eli Gar-
cia scored for Dimmitt on a 
12-yard run. Ricky Gonzales 
added two points with a con-
version run. Plainview struck 
again in the third period with 
a TD and a two-point con-
version, and the fourth quar-
ter was scoreless. 

IIE GREAT CovER-Ups! COUGH and cold remedies 
can cause a person to feel 
drowsy. Don't drive or oper-
ate machinery after taking 
these medications. 

Winners in the Dimmitt 
United Way tennis tourna-
ment, held last weekend on 
Ruskin Racquet Club Courts, 
have been announced. 

The tourney was a benefit 
affair to add to funds being 
collected in the annual UW 
drive. 

In the A Division of the net 
tourney, Cindy Davis was first 
and Suzanne Farris second in 
ladies singles, and they team-
ed to lead the doubles event 
with Beverly Hill and Joyce 
King ranking second. 

Charley Hill and Joe King 
were paired to win mens 
doubles, followed by Charles 
Grisham and Jerry Vera. Mrs. 
Farris and King were winners. 
In mixed doubles, Diane. 
Townsend and Jim Killings-
worth second. 

B Division winner in mens 
singles was Doug Pybus and 
Charles Grisham was second. 
Mrs. King and Pauline Moore 
took first place. D. Townsend 
and Rhenea Webb second in 
ladies doubles. 

Grisham and Bill Harman 
took first place, Pybus and 
Robert Ryan second in mens 
doubles. Mixed doubles win-
ners were Mrs. King and Py-
bus, with LaVon and Don 
Reeve second. 

In the C Division, Deanne 
Clark and Doricell Davis plac-
ed first, Jeanette Malone and 

647.3123 For Printing 

for Tahoka's second touch-
down to climax the game's 
turn-about. Kevin Elmore 
kicked the extra point to give 
the visitors a 14-0 lead with 
3:05 remaining in the first 
half. 

Tahoka threatened again 
before halftime when Brown 
hit White on a 40-yard pass 
play that carried to the Dim-
mitt 20. But time ran out with 
the Bulldogs 14 points up and 
the Bobcats still looking for 
their first score. 

Dimmitt's defense stopped 
the hard-running Bulldogs in 
the third period and the Bob-
cats launched a long-strike 
scoring drive from their 26-
yard line. 

Stewart—after having two 
long gainers nullified by pen-
alties—broke over left guard 
and raced 41 yards for a 
touchdown in the game's 
longest run. The Bobcats opt-
ed for a two-point conversion 
play to close the gap to six, 
but Ryan's pass was incom-
plete and the score stood at 
14-6 when the quarter ended 
a minute later. 

The two teams fought on 

30% 
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even terms through most of 
the fourth quarter, until an-
other Dimmitt turnover led to 
Tahoka's clinching TD. 

With just over four minutes 
remaining, Tahoka fell on a 
Bobcat fumble on the Dimmitt 
24, and two plays later Oages 

GAME AT A GLANCE 
Dimmitt 	 Tahoka 
6 	First Downs 	17 
121 	Rushing Yardage 271 
0 	Passing Yardage 	60 
121 	Total Offense 	331 
0/4 	Passes Att/Comp. 3/6 
4/40 Penalties/Yds. 10/90 
2 	Fumbles Lost 	1 
0 	Interceptions By 	2 
5/34 	Punts/Avg. 	3/27 

* Levelor 
Mini Blinds 

* Woven 

Woods 
Score by Quarters: 
Dimmitt 	0 0 6 0— 6 
Tahoka 	7 7 0 7-21 Call for 

Free Estimate 
After 5 p.m. Scoring Plays: 

T—Clifford Oages, 9 run (Ke- 
vin Elmore kick) 

T—Todd Brown, 21 run (El- 
more kick) 

D—Jimmy Stewart, 41 run 
(Pass failed) 

T—Oages, 25 run (Elmore 
kick) 

CurlewDupe Skip 
730 Pine 

Bonnie KoenInger, 
647-2277 ( 

broke loose on a 25-yard scor-
ing run. Elmore booted his 
third extra point of the night 
to hike Tahoka's lead to 21-6 
with 3:51 remaining. 

The two teams exchanged 
punts again, and Diminitt got 
one last chance to narrow the 
margin when White fumbled 
the ball away at the Dimmitt 
26, with just 25 seconds left. 
But Oages intercepted a Ryan 
pass on the next play and 
returned it to the Dimmitt 22. 
The Cats held for two plays to 
end the contest. 

Stewart was Dimmitt's 
leading runner, gaining 116 
yards in 19 carries for a 6.1 
average. Fullback John Lau-
rent gained 27 yards on only 
two carries. Tahoka came up 
with seven quarterback sacks 
to cut into Dimmitt's net yard-
age. 

White was Tahoka's lead-
ing gainer with 109 yards on 
23 carries. Oages got 85 yards 
in nine trips, and Brown pick-
ed up 56 yards in 11 tries. 

Senior end Gary Naylor 
again sparked the Bobcats on 
both offense and defense, and 
got off one punt that traveled 
50 yards: 

After denying Dimmitt a 
crucial TD in the second quar-
ter and following up with an 
80-yard scoring drive for a 
14-0 lead, Tahoka's Bulldogs 
went on to win a hard-earned 
21-6 decision over the Bobcats 
here Friday night. 

After Tahoka drove 54 
yards for a 7-0 lead with 3:39 
left in the first period, it look-
ed as if Dimmitt was going to 
tie it up when the Bobcats 
moved inside the 1-yard line 
midway in the second. 

Quarterback Robin Ryan—
who had advanced the ball to 
within stepping distance of 
the end zone with a five-yard 
run—handed off to tailback 
Jimmy Stewart through the 
middle for the TD try. But the 
ball popped loose and Tahoka 
recovered it in the end zone 
for a touchback. 

Getting the ball on their 
own 20-yard line, the Bull-
dogs starters a ground march 
that moved .,he ball deep into 
Bobcat territory. The drive 
was highlighted by the con-
sistent running of fullback 
Clifford Oages and speedy 
halfback Tracy White. 

With the ball at Dimmitt's 
21, Bulldog quarterback Todd 
Brown pulled a no-fake rollout 
and raced into the end zone 

Turkey shoot 
is YF event 

Competition in two divi-
sions, for adults and those 14 
and under, will be conducted 
at a turkey shoot sponsored 
by the Dimmitt Young Farm-
ers Sunday afternoon. 

If there are enough entries, 
another division will be set up 
for Young Farmers of this 
area, according to Larry 
Mauldin, DYF publicity chair-
man. Canned hams will be 
given as prizes in all cate-
gories. 

The shoot will begin at 2 
p.m. and the cost will be $5 
per round. Proceeds will be 
used in DYF projects, includ-
ing the annual Junior Stock 
Show which is the club's prin-
cipal project. 

School menus 
at Nazareth 

Here are the lunch menus 
for Nazareth schools for the 
week of Oct. 1-5. 

MONDAY — Lasagna, 
tossed salad, corn, hot rolls, 
butter, apricots, milk. 

TUESDAY — Fried chick-
en, potato salad, pear halves, 
hot buttered bread, peanut 
butter chew, milk.  

WEDNESDAY — Ham and 
beans, cole slaw, carrot 
sticks, corn bread, butter, 
syrup, peach slices, milk. 

THURSDAY — Chili dogs, 
pork and beans, gelatin with 
fruit cocktail, lemon pudding, 
milk. 

FRIDAY — Batter fried 
fish, macaroni and cheese, 
green beans, hot rolls, butter, 
seedless grapes, milk. 

MONT Blanc at 15,771 feet 
is the highest mountain in 
Europe. 

FREE 
Bible Course by Mat 

Write: BIBLE 
Box 245 

Dimmitt, Tex. 

79027 
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WINE consumption has 	THE name of any thorough- 	THE oldest city in the US is 
more than doubled in the US bred racing horse cannot ex- St. Augustine, Fla., establish- 
during the last 10 years. 	ceed 18 letters. 	 ed in 1565.  The Castro County News 
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Funds to fight lung disease 
in children sought in drive 

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press 
Association, Panhandle Press Association and National News-
paper Association. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Year, $9.00 	School Year, $7.50 	Six Months, $5.50 HI-PLAINS OIL CO. 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News .  
Sports, Society, Church News 
Community Correspondence 	 
Personal Items 	  
General News, City and County 	  

Has moved to its new location and is 
now ready to serve you with those fine 

Tuesday Noon 
Monday, 10 A.M. 

Monday Noon 
Monday Noon 

Monday, 5 P.M. 
Tuesday Noon 

Prom dh 
CHAMPLIN PRODUCTS: 
OIL, GAS AND DIESEL bray 

area," she emphasized. 
Mrs. Sammann added that 

CF affects one of every 1,500 
infants born each year, and 
although the disease is in-
curable it can be treated ef-
fectively. 

The taste of salt on a baby's 
skin is a symptom of CF, she 
said in explaining the sig-
nificance of the name for the 
current campaign. 

"When you kiss a baby and 
taste salt on the skin, see a 
doctor because diagnosis and 
immediate treatment are vital 
to his life. So kiss your baby, 
your friends' babies, lots of 
babies this week. You'll love 
it and so will they, and it 
could help detect a serious ill-
ness that might be control-
led," she said. 

We are easy to find at the old Dimmitt Safety 
Lane location at 206 S.E. 2nd, Dimmitt. Or call 

There's more. 
"Hey, Mr.," comes a cry, 

"where's the fiction? I need 
the fiction." 

"It's right in front of you." 
"Where, right in front of 

me?" 
It's even worse when 

they're after something. 
"Hey, Mr., I need a report 

on these little black things." 
"What little black things? 

Beads, bugs, dots . . .?" 
Oh, you know, these little 

black things that roll up in the 
dirt." 

"Worms?" 
"No, you know, they crawl 

under rocks and curl up in a 
ball." 

"Snails?" 
"Oh, never mind. Come on, 

Izzy, the library doesn't have 
anything." 

So you see? That's the ref-
erence interview. By the way, 
will the teacher who assigned 
a report on the little black 
things please tell us what they 
are? 

and educational programs. 
The centers, most located 

at teaching hospitals, provide 
diagnosis, treatment and re-
ferral for children with CF, 
asthma, chronic bronchitis, 
bronchiectasis, "childhood 
emphysema" and recurrent 
pneumonia. There are hospi-
tals dealing with gastrointes-
tinal disorders relating to CF 
located in Dallas, Houston 
and San Antonio. 

"This cause is an important 
one," Mrs. Sammann said. 
"Cystic fibrosis is the No. I 
genetic killer of children and 
about 40 percent of the cases 
are not yet diagnosed. 

"One goal of research is to 
find the cause and cure for 
CF, and another is developing 
better methods of treating 
children with any lung-dam-
aging disease. 

"Almost half the money we 
raise here will stay in this 

Volunteers from the Dim-
mitt Young Homemakers Club 
and the high school Future 
Homemakers will call on their 
neighbors during next week in 
the annual Breath of Life cam-
paign of the National Cystic 
Fibrosis Foundation. 

This year's drive has been 
designated as "Kiss a Baby" 
campaign. 

Funds raised in this cam-
paign will benefit children 
with CF and other diseases of 
the lungs, which annually 
cause deaths of more children 
in the United States than any 
other disease except cancer, 
according to Jeannie Sam-
mann, campaign chairman. 

Bobbi Wooten, business 
solicitation chairman, and 
Mrs. Sammann will lead the 
drive for funds to aid children 
in this area and help support 
a national network of more 
than 100 CF centers, research 647.4549 
Brockman will attend 
Pope's special mass 

Annual picnic 

held by Lucky 
7 CB Club * We are equipped and have the skilled 

workmen to serve all former patrons of 
High Plains Oil Company and Dimmitt 

Safety Lane. 

* For your driving protection we render a 
complete tire, brake, and front end service. 

* We can supply your tire needs with 
Michelin, National and Summit Tires. 

YOUR BUSINESS 
WILL BE APPRECIATED 

Venhaus infant 
services held HI-PLAINS OIL CO. 

The annual picnic for the 
Lucky 7 CB Club was held 
Sunday at the home of Sam 
and Grace Killough. 

Barbecue chicken, hot 
links, hamburger, potato sa-
lad, baked beans and all the 
trimmings were served along 
with ice cream and cake to 39 
people. 

During the business meet-
ing the club decided to con-
tinue the weather watch and 
to host the Muscular Dys-
trophy Telethon again next 
year since it was such a 
success this year. Rest stops 
will be operated again Jan. 1 
and July 4 for motorists trav-
eling through the city on 
major highways. 

"The club is willing to help 
with any community project 
where they can," Killough, 
program chairman, said. 
"The CCL7 Club members 
are aggressive in doing civic 
work to help their commun-
ity." 

Officers for the local CB 
Club are president, Roy Lein-
gang; vice-president, Ken-
neth Taliey; secretary-treas-
urer, Anthony Kirby, and pro-
gram chairman, Killough. 
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SAFETY LANE 

By BRICK AUTRY 
Librarian 

Now that school has started 
many youngsters are trying 
out the library. Thanks to 
various teachers in city 
schools, our afternoons are 
busy with questions and hus-
tle and bustle of many pages 
being flipped, papers being 
shuffled, and pencils being 
tapped. Here is a good reason 
to present to you today the 
following report on the library 
business—the reference inter-
view. 

Every good librarian knows 
that an interview with the 
patron is a must if the precise 
information is to be fetched 
from the shelves. Before one 
gets out of library school 
there is always the class on 
the "patron interview." No 
one leaves without the class, 
however, very few of the haz-
ards are dealt with to a great 
degree. It is simple when a 
body comes through the door 
requesting an article on Pres-
ident Carter's popularity, but 
what is to be done when a 
smarty eighth grader comes 
in? Obviously, if you are 
experienced you will know 
enough to look extra busy as 
not to look too helpful. But if 
you're not . . 

Mr. Smarty Eighth Grader 
comes in the door and goes to 
the desk. 

"I need a report on E. Bing 
Walla or Tayla Cowdway," he 
says. 

On WHO?" 
Upon investigation the re- 

port is supposed to be on 
Irving Wallace or Taylor Cald-
well. "Goodness," I say to 
myself, "I'm just going to 
have to pick up the lingo 
arcund here." 

Holy Family Church at Naz-
areth and is director of the 
National Catholic Rural Life 
Conference in the Amarillo 
Diocese. 

NCRLS is an organization of 
Catholic laity and clergy in-
terested in the preservation of 
Christian life and fellowship 
on the farms and ranches and 
in the rural communities of 
America. 

It is a strong advocate of 
conservation of natural re-
sources and of the family-size 
farm or ranch and through its 
informational, instructive and 
organizational leadership en-
courages and promotes the 
continued health and prosper-
ity of America's rural com-
munities where life is usually 
more relaxed, enjoyable, 
peaceful and satisfying than 
urban dwelling. 

Brockman's task as NCRLC 
director in the diocese is to 
promote these ideals, serve ea. 
a clearing house of informa-
tion, promote meetings and 
activities which lead to a 
deeper appreciation of rural 
values and benefits. 

Brockman and his wife, 
Margaret, anticipate this oc-
casion as a "chance of a life-
time" and hope to return with 
many pictures and a personal 
account of Pope John Paul's 
historic visit to rural America. 

Jerome Brockman of Naz-
areth was notified recently 
that he is one of 150 persons 
chosen to receive Holy Com-
munion from the hands of 
Pope John Paul II at a field 
mass to be celebrated Oct. 4 
at Des Moines, Iowa. 

Brockman is one of 10 di-
ocesan rural life directors in 
the country selected because 
he is actively engaged in 
farming while serving part 
time as a permanent deacon, 
a recently restored ordained 
ministry in the Catholic 
Church. 

A huge crowd is expected 
to take part in this mass 
which the Pope will offer on 
Living Heritage Farm, a work-
ing museum type farm owned 
by a private foundation just 
outside Des Moines. 

This farm, a tourist at-
traction, demonstrates various 
farming techniques and im-
plements from the earliest 
American pioneer days to the 
present. 

Pope John Paul II, like most 
Polish people, has an active 
interest in crop and livestock 
farming and when an invita- 
tion was extended by Bishop 
Maurice Dingman of Des 
Moines, through the National 
Council of Catholic Bishops, 
the Pontiff readily accepted. 

Brockman is a member of 

Funeral services for Aman-
da Dawn Venhaus, infant 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Venhaus, former Naz-
areth residents, were held 
Tuesday in Dumas. 

She is survived by her par-
ents; two brothers, Dave and 
Wade; a sister, Kendra; her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Albert Venhaus and Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Conrad, all of 
Nazareth, and a great-grand-
mother, Mrs. Flora Backus of 
Dimmitt. 

lawariaml, MY GOSH! 
The 1980 MODELS 
will be coming out 
in lust 15 DAYS! 

9/20/79 487712 
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Mr. Jock H. Jones 

And we still have 
18 NEW 1979 MODELS 
in stock that we need to sell. 

• • • • 
• 50 tos75 

.Depending on model purchased. 
nnn 

0890 0031  • • 
• 

• • 
• 
• 

• Estrtra  

VOL GET REBATES 

• • • • • 
• 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

Featuring... 
Conventional and 
Microwave Ovens! 

ON LITTON'S BEST-SELLING MODELS! 

Come in to ci participating Litton Microwave Dealer, 
August 24 - September 30, and we'll show you how 

to get a 550 Rebate on Litton's Even Wove 
Countertop Models 520 and 560. We'll even show 
you how to get a $75 Rebate on a Litton 
Freestanding Range with conventional and 
microwave oven features, Models 631, 6511 970 

and 080. 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• • • • • • • 
• • • • • • 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 
• 
•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

We've got CAPRICES, and IMPALAS, and MALI BU 
CLASSICS, and CHEVETTES, and MONTE CARLOS, 
and BONNEVILLES, and CATALINAS, and a TRANS 
AM (one only) still in stock. We've also got THREE 
DEMONSTRATORS and a DRIVER EDUCATION 
CAR. 

We've got to sell them at 

a rate of ONE A DAY. 
Come out and make us an offer! 

Playing Aug.24th through Sept 30th at a Litton Dealer near you. 

REEVE-PEENING 
KITTRELL ELECTRONICS CHEVROLET, PONTIAC 

385-194 Intersection 	 647-3111 
mennes 

S
S 

103 East Bedford 	 647.2197 *. 



Call 647-4121 
After Hours Call 647.2678, 647.3455, 647.4120 

...For Fast tit Stop 
On Farm Tire Service 

Whether it's tire trouble on your tractor, 
wagon, truck, or car — rely on 'Pit Stop' 
service to get you rolling again, fast! Just 
call this number. It's the next best thing to 
having your own tire shop on wheels. 

We Carry A Wide Selection Of 

TERRA-TIRES &COMBINE TIRES 

FARM TIRE CENTER GOOD/YEAR Complete Headquarters for Farm, 
Truck and Auto Tires 

603 

SE 3rd PAXTON TIRE & SERVICED= 
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Corn harvest at peak, 

lettuce being shipped 

721. Work on replacing burned 	Punt, Pass and Kick 
DDD equipment in progress contest set Saturday 

bad.' 
Corn harvesting may be 75 

percent completed by the end 
of this week in the south part 
of the county, A Sunnyside el-
evator manager said, but is 
"just getting started good" at 
Easter in the northwest sec-
tor. 

Yields are reported better 
than expected and quality of 
the grain is good, with mois-
ture content still somewhat 
high but improving as the 
warm dry weather continues. 
The price dropped a little 
early this week, but was still 
around $5 per hundredweight 
Tuesday. 

Equipment to replace fire-
damaged equipment at Con-
tinental Telephone Company 
here has been received. 

Progress is being made to 
restore direct distance dialing 
service to the affected cus-
tomers of Dimmitt, Hart, Naz-
areth and Sunnyside. 

Employees are now in the 
process of cleaning out the 
destroyed equipment and pre-
paring the new equipment for 

3 

Corn harvesting hit full 
speed this week in all parts of 
Castro County; soybeans from 
a larger crop than usual are 
beginning to come into the 
elevators and vegetable pro-
cessing plants are shipping 
lettuce and carrots as the area 
enjoys near-perfect harvest 
weather. 

A less than normal lettuce 
crop is being marketed with 
good demand and prices hold-
ing at $5.50 to $6, the pro-
cessing plant managers here 
say. 

The crop is short not only 
because some fields were 
wiped out by hail last month, 
but earlier in the summer 
rains caused delays in plant-
ing as they washed out young 
plants. 

So far, the California let-
tuce crop is of poor quality 
and is short because of ex-
treme hot weather on the 
West Coast this summer, so it 
is not competing as strongly 
with the Texas crop as usual. 

Demand is slow for carrots, 
the packers say, and growers 
are being paid only about $30 
a ton. Carrot harvest usually 
extends into December in this 
area. 

The larger soybean crop 
this year is attributed partly 
to plantings made after hail or 
hard rain destroyed young 
cotton, too late in the season 
for replanting that crop. Fast-
er-maturing soybeans were 
planted instead, and are just 
maturing. The price is a little 
lower than expected, an ele-
vator operator said, "but not 

1961 the program has attract-
ed millions of youngsters. 

There is no entrance fee, no 
special equipment is needed 
and participating does not im-
pair a youngster's amateur 
standing. 

Scoring is based on dis-
tance and accuracy with one 
point added for every foot of 
punting, passing and kicking 
distance, and a point sub-
tracted for every foot off the 
center line. 

Twelve national finalists 
will compete for the National 
Championships in their age 
group at Super Bowl XIV on 
Jan. 20 in Pasadena, Calif. 

Winners will have their 
names permanently inscribed 
in the Pro Football Hall of 
Fame in Canton, Ohio. Tro-
phies will be presented by 
NFL Commissioner Pete Ro-
zelle. 

The Punt, Pass and Kick 
county contest will be held at 
2 p.m. Saturday at Bobcat 
Stadium conducted by Stan 
Byrnes Ford. 

Competition is open to boys 
and girls 8 to 13 years of age 
as of Dec. 31, 1979. 

Registration forms are 
available at Richardson El-
ementary School, Dimmitt 
Middle School, Hart Elemen-
tary and Nazareth Elementary 
School. 

There will be six divisions 
in the competition. Trophies 
are to be awarded for first, 
second and third places in 
each division. First place win-
ners will advance to the dis-
trict PPK contest in Amarillo 
Oct. 6. 

PP&K tips books are avail-
able at Stan Byrnes Ford. 

Nationally, PPK is celebrat-
ing its 19th anniversary. It is 
sponsored by the Ford Deal-
ers of America in cooperation 
with the National Football 
League. Since it started in 

replacement, Reeford Bur-
rous, service center super-
visor, said. 

"We hope for an early re-
storal of DDD service for our 
customers. Restoral will be 
upon the completion of testing 
and examination of the new 
equipment," Burrous said 
this week. 

Operators have been im-
ported from other areas to 
serve the needs of the cus-
tomers. "We want to assure 
all customers that station-to-
station calls routed through 
the operators will be given the 
DDD rate," Burrous said. 

The use of DDD service has 
been out as a result of a fire 
on Sept. 9. 

"We appreciate our cus-
tomers' understanding and 
patience in this matter. We 
will continue to keep all our 
customers informed on the 
progress of the equipment re-
placement," Burrous added. 

75 students 
board bus at 
CCH Project 

GRAND CHAMPION OF LUBBOCK SHOW 
. Gaines Howell's Duroc barrow 

Girl Scout 
Swine from county 

organization are tops in shows 
meeting set HOSPITAL NEWS Museum meeting 

and workshop 

on histories set 
The Castro County Museum 

Emergency help 
offered local 
businesses 

money. Crozier showed the 
fifth place middleweight Du-
roc at Lubbock. 

Randy Huseman of Naza-
reth 4-H Club took reserve 
championship for Other Pure-
breds on his heavy pig. 

Other awards at Lubbock 
went to members of the Fu-
ture Farmers chapter at Dim-
mitt High School. Ben Hol-
comb's heavy Duroc, which 
was judged second to How-
ell's animal in its class, was 
reserve champion for his 
breed. 

Brad Brock's lightweight 
Duroc placed first in its class. 
In the Hampshire division, 
Jan Robb showed the first 
place lightweight. 

Danny Underwood won 
sixth place for heavy Hamp-
shires and sixth for light 
Hampshires. Underwood also 
showed the fourth place mid-
dleweight Crossbred. 

Approximately 75 students 
boarded the school bus for the 
first time Monday at the Cas-
tro County Housing Project, 
school superintendent Robert 
'Ryan announced this week. 

The bus will run at 7:45 
a.m. to pick students up for 
school and then will make two 
trips in the afternoon due to 
the difference in dismissal 
times for the different grades. 

The Dimmitt School board 
approved the bus-service plan 
for the students living at the 
Castro County Housing Pro- 
ject at its September meeting. 

Gaines Howell, Dimmitt 
swine breeder, won the grand 
champion trophy and $1,000 
cash award for his Duroc bar-
row at the Panhandle South 
Plains Fair at Lubbock this 
week, after taking the reserve 
championship in the Dumas 
Barrow Futurity, with a $900 
award, last week. 

Barrows from three states 
were entered in the open 
show at the Lubbock fair. 
Howell is a registered Duroc 
breeder. His pig won first 
place for heavyweight Durocs 
and the breed championship 
before going on to become the 
show champ. Howell also took 
third place for a Crossbreed. 

Another championship bar-
row from Dimmitt was shown 
by Bobby Crozier last week in 
the Tri-State Fair at Amarillo. 
His was a middleweight Du-
roc which won $200 in prize 

15—LEGAL NOTICES' 

A meeting for parents of 
any girl interested in becom-
ing a member of Girl Scouts 
or Brownies will be held at 7 
p.m. next Wednesday in the 
city hall assembly room. 

More leaders for Girl 
Scouts in Dimmitt are needed, 
and any mother interested in 
working with the program is 
urged to attend this organi-
zation meeting, which is for 
adults only. 

Parents of a girl who is 
interested in joining Girl 
Scouts or Brownies, who are 
unable to attend the meeting 
next week are invited to tel-
ephone Beth Dutton at 647-
3175. 

Registration forms will be 
distributed in Dimmitt schools 
Monday. Girls are asked to 
have the forms completed so 
the parents can take them to 
the meeting, or they may be 
returned to Mrs. Dutton. County purchases 

four road graders 
Helen Hamby 

services held 
the Sheriff's Account should 
be turned over to the county 

a small
an em- 

PLAINS MEMORIAL 
Mr. and Mrs. Ruddy Mar-

tinez of Hereford are parents 
of a girl, Micala. Born Sept. 
17, she weighed 6 pounds, 
151/2  ounces. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Cal-
houn of Sanford are parents of 
a girl. Kellie Jo was born 
Sept. 19 and weighed 7 
pounds, 5'/2 ounces. She has 
two sisters, Scottie and Rob-
bie, and grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Bailey of Hart 
and Mr. and Mrs. E. P. 
Calhoun of Dimmitt. 

Association will hold its meet-
ing at 8 p.m. today (Thurs-
day) in the museum building 
on West Halsell St. 

A workshop to help resi-
dents prepare family histories 
for the Castro County History 
book is announced for Friday, 
from 2 to 8 p.m. in the meet-
ing room of Rhoads Memorial 
Library. This session is being 
sponsored by the history book 
committee. 

All county residents, past 
and present, are urged to 
submit brief family stories for 
the volume, which will also 
contain an outline of the 
county's history and stories of 
its early settlement, the 
schools, churches and com-
munities as well as the people 
who contributed to its pro- 
gress. 

The committee members 
will be present at the work-
shop to assist those who are 
not sure how the family his-
tories should be written. 

An emergency business no-
tification plan has been start-
ed by the Dimmitt Police De-
partment to assist local of-
ficers in contacting business-
men after hours in the event 
of burglary, fire, or open 
doors. 

Many Dimmitt business 
have been contacted but the 
assistance of those businesses 
not contacted is being sought. 

"If the business has not 
been contacted," Virginia Ca 
wert, PD secretary, said, "we 
urge managers to get in con-
tact with our office to give us 
the needed information." 

The police department 
needs the name and phone 
number of the owner, and the 
name of another person who 
can be contacted in the event 
that the owner is not avail-
able. 

The phone number of the 
police department is 647-
4545. 

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL: 
Juanita Alaniz 
Janice Bell 
Arsenia Catano 
Cleo Chavez 
Ruby Coke 
Leonard Dempsey 
Mary Fulfer 
Andrea Guerro 
Nicolasa Hernandez 
Robert Huseman 
Pat Keith 
Linda Leal 
Geneva Mitchell 
San Jacinto Pasada 
Antonio Rodriquez 
Albino Trevino 
Chester Youts 

PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
Sara Martinez 
Danny Ray Boaz 
Joyce Ewing 
Vicki Smithson 
Dorothy Yates 
Agnes Brockman 
Luther Kilgore 
De Anna Calhoun 
Modesta Sandoval 
Gloria Vera 
Zola Langford 
Janice Bell 
Tracy Grand 
Elmer Huseman 
Dora Newberry 
Dora Mooney 
Josephine Jackson 
Kristin Brockman 
Balerio Ochoa 

NO. 1564 
ESTATE OF E. A. NOBLE, 
DECEASED 
IN THE COUNTY COURT OF 
CASTRO COUNTY, TEXAS 

NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST 

THE ESTATE OF E. A. 
NOBLE, DECEASED 

Notice is hereby given that 
original Letters Testamentary 
for the Estate of E. A. Noble 
were issued on September 24. 
1979, in Cause No. 1564, pend-
ing in the County Court of 
Castro County, Texas, to A. J. 
NOBLE, Independent Execu-
tor, 

The 'residence and mailing 
address of such Executor is Box 
753, Denver City, Texas 79323. 

The persons having claims 
against this estate which is 
currently being administered 
are now required to present 
them within the time and in the 
manner prescribed by law. 

-s- A. J. NOBLE 
Independent Executor of the 

Estate of E. A. Noble, 
Deceased 
15-52-1tc 

A request by Bob Killough 
to rent a quonset building 
near the' Expo Building was 
denied. 

The Castro County Com-
missioners' Court accepted 
bids from West Tens Equip- treasurer &cept for 
ment Co. for the purchase of 'amount t6The left in 
four road graders at its meet- Ibrgency fund. 
ing Monday. 

Two of the Caterpillar mo-
tor graders are for Precinct 1 
and one each for Precincts 2 
and 4. A bid had previously 
been accepted to purchase a 
road grader for Precinct 3. 

The machines will probably 
be delivered in about three 
months, at which time the 
ones now in use will be traded 

GIANT AUCTION 
of 

in. 

The commissioners voted 
that the accumulated funds in 

Funeral services for Helen 
Owens Hamby, 49, of Olton, 
stepmother of Houston Ham-
by of Hart, were held Sunday 
in Jayton. 

Mrs. Hamby died in a Lub-
bock nursing home Friday. 

She was a native of Aber-
nathy and a member of the 
First Baptist Church of Jay-
ton, where she formerly lived. 

She is survived by her hus-
band, J. C. Hamby of Olton; a 
daughter, Stephanie Owens, 
and a son, Steve Owens, both 
of Lubbock; a stepson Hous-
ton Hamby of Hart, a step-
daughter Saundra McCoy of 
Plainview; two brothers and 
two sisters. 

A request from the County 
Historical Committee that the 
county underwrite the cost—
$150 per page—of the history 
of the county in the pastro 
County history book Ow be-
ing prepared was favprably 
considered. 

The exact cost will not be 
known until the history is ed-
ited and placed in the book. 

CUT HARVEST 
DOWNTIME! 

Antiques & Collectiblet 
SATURDAY, SEPT. 29 STARTS AT 10:30 A.M. 

At the Home of 
JOHN HUTCHISON, 600 S.W. Third, Dimmitt 
This is the PERSONAL COLLECTION of John 
Hutchison, accumulated over the past 40 years. Acres 
and acres of authentic antique items, plus garden- 
fresh vegetables. 

ANTIQUES Flat Trailer Iron 
Trash Can with Stand 
Electric Winch, w/ 100-ft. cable 
Chain Hooks 
Homemade Trailer Chassis 
Fencing Slats 
Lumber Bundler 
Shovels 
Pitchforks 
Hammers 
Hatchets 
Rakes 
Pickup Camper 

Dinner Bell 
Telephone Chair 
Tools—Wrenches, Hammers, 

Etc. 
Many, Many other items too 

numerous to mention. 

Flat Trunks 
TV Set ]30 yrs. old] 
Crosscut Saw 
Frame Saws 
School Desks 
Kid's Saddle 
Horseshoes 
Cream Cans 15 & 10 gal.] 
Plow Seats 
Sewing Machines 
Steam Cleaning Tool Vat 
Bicycle 
Flat Irons 
Cotton Scales 
Wood Well Pulley 
Wash Boards 
Wash Boilers [Copper & Tin] 
Copper Distiller 
Two Rocking Chairs 
Iron Skillets 
Tea Kettle 
Daisy Churns 
Machete Knives 
Coffee Grinder 
3-Gal. Churn 
Crock Jars 
Fruit Jars 
Butter Mold 

HOUSEHOLD ITEMS 
Breakfast Table 
Cook Stove 
Deep Freeze [needs fan motor] 
Electric Refrigerator 
Plumbing Fixtures 
Sewing Machine 
Beauty Shop Chair 
Vinyl Living Room Chair 
Bed Springs 

FRESH VEGETABLES 

SHOP ITEMS 

Tomatoes 
Okra 
Watermelons 
Pumpkins 
Onions 
Squash 
Dipper Gourds 

Butane Bottles [50-gal.] 
Cutting-Welding Torch Unit 

Craftsman, with new 50-ft. 
extension hose] 

Sprayers 
Boomers 
Bolts & Nails by the Gallons 
Log Chains 
Oil Field Chains 
55-Gal. Barrels 

MISCELLANEOUS 
Belt Buckles 
Cigarette Lighters 
Acres & Acres of Miscellaneous 

Items Too Numerous to Men- 
tion 

For information call John Hutchison at 647-4606 or 
Dick Ratjen at 488-2251. 

All accounts to be settled on day of sale; nothing to be removed until settled for. Not responsible for 

accidents. 

Auctioneer: DICK RATJEN of Happy License No. TXS-010-0189 



Happy - 

anniversarg 

SAVINGS 
RATES 

FOUR YEAR 
CERTIFICATE 

* Pays 1% below the 
of a four year govenment 
* Has a term of four 

VARIABLE RATE 
ISSUED IN SEPTEMBER 

Annual Rate 	8.20% 

Annual Yield 	8.54% 

average yield 	* Compounds interest daily 
security. 	*FSLIC Insured to $40,000 

years 	* $100 Minimum Deposit 

5% % 
Annual Rate 

5.65 % 
Annual Yield SAVINGS 

PASSBOOK 
(`10 min.) 

THIRTY MONTH 634% 
CERTIFICATE ($100 MIN.) Annual Rate 

6.98% 
Annual Yield 

ONE YEAR 
CERTIFICATE ($100 MIN.) 	- 6% % 

Annual Rate 

6.72% 
Annual Yield 

THREE MONTH 
CERTIFICATE ($100 MIN.) 53/4% 

Annual Rate 
5.92% 
Annual Yield 

MONEY MARKET 
CERTIFICATE 

* Hasa term of 26 Weeks 
* $10,000 Minimum Deposit 
* Not compounded 

s (Effective 

CURRENT 

1 1 0. 
RATE 

14% 
9-27-79) 

Federal regulations require a substantial interest penalty for early 
withdrawals from certificates of deposit. However, penalties are 
only imposed on the amount withdrawn. 

Regular passbook accounts earn from 
date of deposit to date of withdrawal, 
The passbook accounts, along with the 
thirty month, one year, and three 
month certificates earn interest com-
pounded daily and paid by check or 

added to the account quarterly. Cer-
tificates are automatically renewed. 
All funds are insured in each type of 
account to $40,000 by the FSLIC and 
all funds are available at all times 
from all accounts. 

11010 Sums 
lean Association 

Hereford, Texas 

Dimmitt Branch 3rd & Bedford 647.2189 

WAIVER OF FINANCE 
Used 4WD tractors taken in trade on the sale of a new 4WD tractor on or 
before October 31, 1979, or any other used equipment sold with the used 
tractor will be eligible for Waiver of Finance. Finance charges will be waived 
to March 1. 1980. See us for details 

HAYS 
IMPLEMENT COMPANY 

647.2151 

4plus4deat 
Buy an International 4586 or 
4786 4-Wheel Drive tractor 
before October 31, 1979—and 
we'll give you a new Scout 
4-Wheel Drive FREE. See us 
today for details. 
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Teresa 's topics 

Socially 
1W Yours 

4-H food group open 
By TERESA L. CRISWELL 

THE statement "All men 
are born free and equal" does 
not exist in the United States 
Constitution or the Declara-
tion of Independence. 

THE first woman rabbi was 
Sally Jane Priesand, who was 
ordained in June, 1972 in the 
Isaac M. Wise Temple in 
Cincinnati, Ohio. 

brownie. It will be moist and 
chewy. 

Cool Strawberry Shake 
Strawberry ice cream 
1 cup milk 
Place about 11/2  to 2 cups of 

strawberry ice cream in a 
shaker, jar with a lid, or 
blender. Add the milk. Cover 
the shaker with lid; shake 
hard. Pour into glasses. 
Serves 2. 

Tasty Chili 
1 medium onion, chopped 
1 pound ground beef 
2 8-oz. cans tomato sauce 
1 teaspoon salt 
1 16-ounce can pinto beans, 

optional 
11/2  teaspoons chili powder. 
Cook and stir onion and 

ground beef in saucepan until 
meat is lightly browned. 
Spoon off excess fat. Stir in 
tomato sauce; cook over heat. 
Add salt and beans if desired. 
Cook until hot. Stir in chili 
powder. Serve with crackers. 
Serves 6 people. 

If you are at least nine 
ears old, you are eligible to 
an to 4-H foods and nutrition 
roject group. 
In the project you will learn 

3 prepare different kinds of 
)od, learn what nutrients you 
eed to be a healthy person; 
ou will learn about meal 
Manning, food buying, food 
afety, and social and cultural 
oles. Learning to prepare 
Ashes is lots of fun when you 
re learning with a friend. 
At the end of the project, 

hose who are interested can 
to in the County Food Show 
nd win a ribbon for what you 
iave prepared and the things 
'ou have learned. 

The 4-H foods and nutrition 
project is open to any boy or 
girl between the ages of 9-19, 
regardless of your economic 
level, color, race, sex, religion 
or national origin. If you are 
interested contact Teresa 
Criswell, County Extension 
Agent, at 647-4115 before 5 
p.m. Friday. 

Included are a few recipes 
that you may be trying in your 
project group. Try it, I know 
you'll like it. 

Butterscotch Brownies 
1/2  cup margarine, softened 
2 cups brown sugar, firmly 

packed 
2 eggs 
11/2  cups flour 
2 teaspoons baking powder 
1 teaspoon vanilla 
1 cup nuts, chopped, op-

tional 
Cream margarine until fluf-

fy. Add sugar and beat until 
very light. Add eggs. Stir 
flour and baking powder into 
the mixture. Add vanilla and 
nuts. Pour into a greased and 
lightly floured pan, 11x7'/2x 
11/2 . Bake at 350 degrees F. 
for 30 to 35 minutes. Cool and 
cut in squares. Yield: 24 
squares. 

This is not a cake-like 

OCTOBER WEDDING PLANNED—Mr. and Mrs. Julian 
Falcon announce the approaching marriage of their daughter, 
Teresa, to Dean Gripp, son of Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Gripp of 
Star Route, Hereford. Vows will be exchanged Oct. 27 in Holy 
Family Catholic Church in Nazareth. 

Order next year's 

P Yffie;anc  • 
Again this year Pioneer® brand seeds 
have shown superior performance in 
this area. And many farmers are already 
getting their names on the line to be 
sure they'll have their most wanted 
Pioneer® brand hybrids for planting 
next spring. 

Party honors 
Shirley Hall 

Committees 
for area 
meet named 

COUPLE PLANS TO WED—Mr. and Mrs. Rex Wooten 
announce the approaching marriage of their daughter, Joyce 
Ann, to Randy Dwayne Bills, son of Mr. and Mrs. Richard Bills 
of Earth. The couple plans to be married at 6 p.m. Thanks-
giving Day, Nov. 22, at the First Baptist Church in Dimmitt. 
Miss Wooten, employed at Citizens State Bank in Earth, is a 
graduate of Dimmitt High School and attended Texas Tech 
University. Bills is a graduate of Springlake-Earth High School, 
attended South Plains College and farms. 

Police calls' 

Shirley Hall was honored at 
a going away party in the 
home of Arlene Newman last 
week. Mrs. Hall is leaving her 
post as Chamber of Com-
merce manager. 

Pickup foods were served. 
Those attending the party 
were Mrs. Newman, Marzelle 
Powell, Frances Frazier, 
Goldie Stanton, Mae Har-
grove, Maxine Childers, Janet 
Mann, Dolores Baldridge, 
Juanita Welch and Billye 
Gwynn Davis. 

Mrs. Hall was presented 
with a money tree. 

Robert E. Ewing 

completes training 

ORDER NOW ... IT HELPS ... 
• assure you of getting the Pioneer brand hy-
brids you want in the quantities you need. 

• remove the pressure from planting time —
the last thing you should be worrying about at 
planting is getting your hands on the seed you 
need. 

• free up your dealer's time at planting so we 
can do a better job of serving your total needs. 

Pvt. Robert E. Ewing has 
completed his training as a 
cannoneer under the One Sta-
tion Unit Training Program at 
the US Army Field Artillery 
School at Fort Sill, Okla. 

Ewing is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert E. Ewing of 
Dimmitt. 

Fifteen hundred dollars in 
tools were reportedly taken 
from Dimmitt Motor Co. 
Tuesday. 

The burglar gained entry by 
breaking a window and then 
opening the door enough to 
crawl under. The case is still 
under investigation. 

Police also investigated two 
traffic accidents during the 
week and several other minor 
incidents. 

IN 1953 jockey Willie Shoe-
maker rode 485 winning thor-
oughbreds in 255 days. 647-3123 For Printing 

Order by 
December 15th. 
Get this wallet 
FREE! 

OSUT is a 13-week period 
which combines basic combat 
training with advanced indi-
vidual training. 

Won't work its way out of your pocket. Suede panels hold 
it snugly in place through a busy working day. Quality ma-
terials. Re-inforced stitching for long life. 5-window credit 
card section. 

Call or come see us NOW! 
Castro County Grain Co., Dimmitt 647.3347 

Flagg Grain Co., Inc., Dimmitt 647-2133 
So. Nazareth Farm Store, Inc., 

Nazareth 945-2225 
Mr. Lonnie K. Wilson, Dimmitt 986.3431 

Committees for the Area 
Recognition Day which the 
Dimmitt Tops Club will host 
here Nov. 3 were announced 
at the club's weekly meeting 
in Rhoads Memorial Library 
Monday evening. Oleta Raper 
will serve as general chair-
man. 

Francis Goodwin is chair-
man of advertising and pub-
licity, Vivian Pigg of decora-
tions, Nelle Newton of re-
freshments, Emily Clinging-
smith of scrapbooks and name 
tags. 

The special day will bring 
members from over the entire 
West Texas area as far south 
as San Angelo. The local club 
expects around 250 visitors. 

The September fellowship 
session followed the business 
meeting Monday and plans 
were made for a Halloween 
masquerade party as the Oc-
tober fellowship, on Oct. 29. 

Mrs. Raper presided at the 
meeting, when 26 members 
recorded a total weight loss of 
10 pounds for the week. Mrs. 
Pigg was Kops of the Week. 
James Slough, with a loss of 4 
pounds, 8 ounces, and Mar-
garet Waggoner, who lost 1 
pounds, 12 ounces, were Tops 
of the Week. 

166\ PIONEER®  E  
SEEDS 

!'Registered trademark of Pioneer Hi-Bred International, Inc , PHYB '79 

REDUCE the setting on a 
gas water heater from high 
140 degrees F. to normal 120 
degrees F. and reduce the gas 
it uses by 18 percent. 

Classifieds Gets Results 

Kompiled from the Common= 
Iity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration; 
Council and the Nazareth 
American Legion Nixiliaryl 

SEPTEMBER 27 — Marcel-
la Flores, Phil King, Clyde 
Damron, Joylyn Broderson, J. 
B. Blackwell, Jerry Thomas, 
John Martin, Russell Hoel-
ting, Brenda Annen, Denis 
Hoelting, Melvin Wethington, 
Bobbie Schmucker, Roger 
Huseman, Lori Schulte, Ema-
line Pohlmeier, Nancy Ring-
wald, Urban Ball, Jeremy 
Schmucker, Harold Wilhelm. 

SEPTEMBER 28 — Buck 
Kenworthy, Chris Fry, Oneida 
Hutto, Bob McLean, Ronald 
Golden, Mable Brock, Joe 
Kleman. 

SEPTEMBER 29 — Sharla 
Jackson, Kristi Sims, Jeri 
Small, Betty Burrous, Gladys 
Fortenberry, Courtney Hoel-
ting. 

SEPTEMBER 30 — Alma 
Ott, Donna Newton, Terry 
Robison, Manuel Martinez, 
Marlin Albert Durbin. 

OCTOBER 1 — Norma Ca-
tano, Lonnie Bell, Heath 
Schulte, Howie Annen, Eddie 
Schulte. 

OCTOBER 2 — Todd Cam-
eron, James Roberts, Todd 
West, Paralyn Moore, Pat An-
thony, Kenneth Malone, Sisco 
Cathey, Dorothy Ellis. 

OCTOBER 3 — Denise 
Dobbs, Denise Smith, R. C. 
West, Ken Shannon, Gary 
Broadstreet, Ja Cameron, 
Rhonda Hoelting, Ernest 
Brockman. 

et 	 \fa? 
[Compiled from the Commun'  

; ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstratio* 
'Council and the Nazareth  
American Legion Auxiliary.] 

SEPTEMBER 27 — Bob 
and Jackie Crozier, Jim and 
Linda Roberts, John and Nell 
Martin, Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Broadstreet. 

SEPTEMBER 28 — Earl 
and Mable Brock, Spurgeon 
and Oneida Hutto, Marvin 
and Alvina Jones. 

SEPTEMBER 29 — Bob 
and Wanda Kay. 

OCTOBER 2 — Max and 
Charolett Sageser, Donny and 
Cindy McDaniel, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bert Longoria, Mr. and 
Mrs. Sam Lane, Wayne and 
Gladys Gipson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Schmucker. 

OCTOBER 3 — Jim and 
Carlene Long, Woodrow and 
Alyce Killingsworth. 

NAL auxiliary 
installs officers t 

t  
t 

4 

The Nazareth American Le-
gion Auxiliary installed new 
officers at its regular monthly 
meeting. 

An audit was conducted for 
the period of September 1977 
to September of 1979. A sum-
mary of the money given out 
by the auxiliary included 
$847.24 in donations, $480 for 
educational 	scholarships, 
$465.10 for assessments such 
as V.A. poppies, etc., $850 for 
Girls State expenses and 
$1,025 for bingo jackpots that 
were given away. 



Mens 

LONG-SLEEVE 

SWEAT-SHIRTS 
Reg. $499  

Now 

0 
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4-H steering 
committee 
shapes plans 

The Castro County 4-H 
youth sub-committee met last 
Wednesday in the assembly 
room of the courthouse. This 
was the first meeting of the 
committee, whose purpose is 
to aid in involving youth of 
the county in activities spon-
sored by the Texas Agricul-
tural Service. 

Activities and projects 
agreed upon by the committee 
as the most effective to realize 
that purpose are implement-
ing programs at schools, or-
ganizing a county fair booth, 
sending birthday cards to 
nine-year-olds, Fun Day Ol-
ympics, bicycle project and 
rodeo and a Christmas party 
for all the youth of the county. 

These activities will be or-
ganized by the committee, the 
Extension Service staff and 
4-H members and leaders 
throughout the year. 

The committee is enthusias-
tic about the new project and 
invites suggestions and sup-
port in carrying out these ac-
tivities, according to Neal Tin-
dol, assistant county agent 
and 4-H Club director. 

aahOnein  
' 	

1 

C R ANTHONY CO  

It's End-Of - the- 	
i
‘ 

Month cleaning 
time at Anthony's 

. this means Big 
Savings to YOU on 
mony needed items! 
So STOP by and 
browse oround 

FIREMAN OF THE YEAR Bill Conyers [left) 	Youts at the annual Dimmitt Firemen's Ban- 
and Runner•up Ben Reyes Jr. show the 	quet last Thursday night. 
awards they received from Mayor Elmer 

master charge 
THE IWTERSANA CARS 

Bill Conyers is named 
city's 'Fireman of Year' 

Three Days \3/4  
ONLY 

Thurs., Fri., 
& Sat. 

II 

P. 
0 

Photography by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

WEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS, TEXAS 

Box 484 	Phone 684-2535 

These & Many 

More E. 0. M. 

Specials 
Bill Conyers was announced 

as the Dimmitt Volunteer Fire 
Dept.'s "Fireman of the 
Year" and Ben Rayes Jr. as 
the runner-up at the annual 
Firemen's Banquet last 

were present. 
Fire Chief Clarence "Dag-

wood" Wood, who left his 
hospital bed to attend the 
banquet. thanked those who 
handled the banquet details 
and commended the depart-
ment as "a good group of 
men." 

The banquet, attended by 
more than 50 firemen, wives 
and guests, featured a catered 
barbecue dinner. 0 

PANTS 
(Select Group) 

Reg. $900  

Famous 

Anthony 

DRESS SLACKS 
Double Knit or Poly Gab. 	6.  

0 

$688  
Pr. 

- 	Ladies 
Petite, Average, 

Tall 

Not All Sizes 
In All Colors 

Reg. 92" 	

11 
Now 

$1 088  
Pr. 

1 

MAKE OUR LOSS 
YOUR GAIN! 

Due to the August hailstorms, the Sunnyside 

cotton crop is slim. We are fully repaired 

and offer prompt, efficient service with a 

minimum of waiting time for traitors. 

Your business would be appreciated. 

ROSS FAMILY GIN 
SUNNYSIDE 

647-2341 

Thursday night. 
In announcing the award 

winners, Mayor Elmer Youts 
said the department had 103 
calls during the year-27 fires 
inside the city. 25 fires out-
side the city, and 51 practices. 
Conyers led the department 
by making 97 of the calls, 
while Rayes was present at 
91. 

Conyers, 32, has been a 
member of the DVFD six 
years, and has attended fire-
men's schools at College Sta-
tion, Lubbock and Canyon. 
He's also a member of the 
district championship pumper 
team. 

Rayes, 26. joined the DVFD 
four years ago, and is now 
secretary of the department. 
He's a member of the pumper 
team that won the district 
championship, and has at-
tended firemen's schools at 
College Station and Canyon. 

Main speaker at the ban-
quet was Rev. Doug Man-
ning, pastor of Hereford's 
First Baptist Church, who 
drew constant guffaws with a 
short joke-filled speech. Mas-
ter of ceremonies was Jerry 
Marvin. 

Four retired members of 
the department were present 
at the banquet. They were J. 
D. Rodgers of 1.1.J Lake, John 
Hardy Wood of Levelland, 
Harlan Dodd and J. B. Black-
well. Mrs. Rodgers, Mrs. 
Dodd and Mrs. Blackwell also 

ii 

SHOES-SHOES-SHOES 
it 
O 

LADIES-MENS-CHILDRENS 

Group I 
Vol. to $21" 

Group II 
Vol. to $10" 

88 Now 
$8

pr. 

Now  $388 Pr. 

County ACS 

Unit receives 
awards, plaque 

Awards were presented to 
officers of the Castro County 
Unit, American Cancer So-
ciety, at its September meet-
ing last Thursday. 

Golden Achievement 
Awards went to George Lam-
berth, president, and Paul 
Weaver, fund campaign lead-
er, for reaching an all-time 
high in Cancer Crusade in-
come. A certificate of auth-
orization was given to the 
county unit as a whole. 

Nancy Acker, who received 
a Special Events Plaque, in 
turn presented it to Cleo For-
son for her assistance and 
backing. The presentations 
were made by Al Themes, 
District 15 leadership devel-
opment chairman, who with 
Gary Moberly, area repre-
sentative, was a guest. 

Dale Wells was elected 
vice-president to succeed 
Shirley Hall, who resigned 
that office. Wells volunteered 
to serve as special events 
chairman. 

Mrs. Acker gave a short re-
view of a division meeting in 
Houston which she attended 
in July, saying that emphasis 
was on special events and 
public information activities of 
units. 

Here's Hart's 

school menu 

it 
0 

Pictures Do Not 

Necessarily 

Men's 
Utility 
Jacket 

Quilted Nylon 
water repellent 
jacket with 
zipper front. 
90 0 0  Acrylic 
lining and 10% 
other fiber. 
Reg. $12.99 

$1088 
Ea. 

Represent Styles 

4 

1  
L 

• 

77` it sin 
Save tic's\ 30 	to j3 , to Spring 
and Summer fabrics 

Here are the menus for 
Hart schools for the week of 
Oct. 1-5. 

MONDAY — Breakfast: 
Bacon, eggs, biscuits, jelly, 
milk. Lunch: Corn dogs, ranch 
style beans, cole slaw, peanut 
butter brownies, milk. 

TUESDAY — Breakfast: 
Cinnamon toast, applesauce, 
milk. Lunch: Pinto beans with 
ham, corn bread, French 
fries, buttered spinach, peach 
cobbler, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Break-
fast: Cold cereal, fruit, milk. 
Lunch: Enchilada casserole, 
tossed salad, buttered corn, 
orange cake, milk. 

THURSDAY — Breakfast: 
Donuts, juice, milk. Lunch: 
Cheeseburger on homemade 
bun, potato tots, gelatin, 
milk. 

FRIDAY 	Breakfast: Hot 
cakes, butter, syrup, milk. 
Lunch: Roast beef with brown 
gravy, hot rolls, green beans, 
creamed potatoes, apple cob-
bler, milk. 

U.'. Paine L SERVICE 
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