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In support of farm strike 

Nazareth residents' Christmas gift 
to the area, the annual nativity pag-
eant in the Holy Family Catholic 
Church, will be presented at 8 p.m. 
Sunday, then repeated at the same 
hour Dec. 21 and 23. 

A cast of the church's members who 
reverently portray the New Testament 
story of Christ's birth, and a choir 
which sings the exultant music of the 
season, combine to present the 13 
scenes with elaborate settings and 
costumes fashioned by the hands of 
town residents. 

Attendance has grown each year 
and out-of-town visitors are advised to 
made advance reservations by tele-
phone call to Tulia, 627-4436, or Naz-
areth, 945-2229 or 945-2574. There is 
no admission charge and no com-
mercialization of the pageant. 

In its sixth year now, the pageant 
had its start from a dream of the Rev. 
Stanley Crocchiola, Holy Family pas-
tor, about a program to embody the 
simplicity, beauty and truth of the 
First Christmas. 

Merchants closeWednesday 
A Hart businessman reported Wed-

nesday that every business except the 
bank and one service station were 
closed. 

"Our merchants are definitely sup-
porting the strike, and closing Wed-
nesday was the best way they could 
show it," he said. "I really don't think 
the closing will hurt business here—
we're all in a crunch anyway." 

In Nazareth, the only store open was 
Home Mercantile, which houses the 
post office. 

"There was no way to close the 
store without closing the post office, 
and we're barred by federal law from 
doing that," store owner Nellie Wil-
helm reported, "so we stayed open 
during post-office hours." 

While Castro County's cities were 
closed voluntarily Wednesday, local 
farmers helped force the closing of se-
lected food distributors in Amarillo. 
Twenty-five men and their wives took 
nine tractors to Amarillo Tuesday 
night to help picket the Affiliated 
Foods and Safeway warehouses and 
Borden's Creamery. 

Another team of picketers left Dim-
mitt Wednesday morning to relieve 
the strikers who had been on the 
picket lines all night Tuesday. 

Farmers from throughout the north-
ern Panhandle, disgruntled at the re-
ception their Amarillo rally received, 
decided at a regional meeting Monday 

Springfield, Colo., just 11 weeks ago 
but has mushroomed into a surprising 
show of unity among the nation's 
farmers. 

Local AA members met with bus-
inessmen at the AA office Monday to 
request the Wednesday closing and 
explain their motives. 

Many merchants agreed readily, but 
others claimed they were threatened 
into closing, and were warned that 
they "would have to suffer the con-
sequences" if they didn't. 

American Agriculture members—
who work without officers—were di-
vided on what their feelings would be 
toward any business that didn't close. 

"We're going to try in every way we 
can to not offend or hurt anybody in 
any way," one AA spokesman said at 
Monday's meeting. "We're not going 
to throw a brick through anybody's 
window or burn anybody's barn. That 
would be self-defeating—it would get 
us a black eye, and that's not the kind 
of people we are." 

But he added, "If there is a busi-
ness that's not closed down Wednes-
day in sympathy, I wouldn't be in 
favor of supporting him any more." 

Another farmer commented, "I 
don't want to do anything to hurt our 
Dimmitt businesses. I depend on them 
as much as they depend on me, and a 
lot of them are in as bad a hind as I 

Business activity came to a near-
standstill in Dimmitt, Hart and Naz-
areth Wednesday as merchants closed 
their stores for the day in support of 
the national farmers' strike. 

The strike started at midnight Tues-
day. Striking farmers vow they will 
hold their commodities off the market, 
buy only essentials and "do whatever 
we have to do" until they get 100% of 
parity for their products. 

The strike is coordinated by Ameri-
can Agriculture, a loose-knit move-
ment that started in a coffee shop in 

It remained a dream until a talented 
new member of the parish, Donna Bir- 
kenfeld, accepted the task of writing 
the scripts, arranging and composing 
music to fit it, and leading other 
members in staging the initial pag-
eant. 

Near-capacity crowds attended, 
catching the spirit of the effort by resi-
dents of the little West Texas town 
which was named for Christ's boyhood 
home. They inspired plans for a bigger 
pageant with more beautiful staging, 
so seamstresses and painters went to 
work immediately. 

After Mrs. Birkenfeld's tragic death 
in an automobile accident early in 
1974, the community was even more 
determined to carry on the pageant as 
a memorial to her. Her original script 
and songs are still the basis for the 
production. 

Almost everyone in the church has 
some part in the pageant—acting, 
singing, staging or costuming. Jimmy 
Braddock Schulte is stage director with 
Richard Birkenfeld and Florene Brock-
man as assistants. 

Sybil Steffens and Ethel Schmucker 
are in charge of costumes, Jim Hoel-
ting of lighting, Faye Schmucker of 
makeup. 

In the cast this year, Mary Beth 
Ramaekers has the role of Mary, 
Russell Schacher of Joseph and Albert 
Hartman of the Angel Gabriel. 

Dozens of others appear as shep-
herds, kings, village people, and in an 
especially dramatic scene, the Roman 
soldiers sent by Herod to kill babies of 
the area in an attempt to take the life 
of the infant Christ. 

The choir of 30 voices is directed by 
Noreen Kleman Carson, a Nazareth 
High School graduate now majoring in 
music at West Texas State University. 

King speaks to 
Sooners on strike 

Band-choir 
concert set 

Accident, violations 

to make Amarillo a target area. 
"We're going to give Amarillo a 

story because they haven't given us 
much publicity and haven't paid much 
attention to us," one farmer said 
Monday. "We got a lot better re-
ception in Austin than we did in Ama-
rillo." 

Other selected cities across the na-
tion—mostly food distribution centers 
or capitals—cropped up as target 
areas Wednesday. As the strike got 
underway, AA members were staying 
mum about their future strike plans, 
except to say that a "Phase fl" is in 
the offing. 

Meanwhile, spokesmen for the Car-
ter Administration predicted that the 
strike would be ineffective, and said 
the administration doesn't intend to 
alter its farm program. 

However, AA members have vowed 
they won't let up until the Ad-
ministration does replace the present 
farm program with the farmer-written 
proposal that has been introduced in 
Congress as the "Emergency Farm 
Act of 1977." 

"The news media has missed one 
thing in this whole conflict," a Hart 
businessman said. "It has been lis-
tening to the government and not the 
farmers. The government reports a 
surplus, but the government doesn't 
own these commodities—the farmers 
do. And those commodities aren't 
going to go anywhere. It's going to be 
real interesting to see what the res-
ponse is when this food doesn't go on 
the market." 

THE WINNER—Former Congressman 
Bob Price [R-Pampa] defeated State 
Representative Bob Simpson [D-Am-
arillo) by a narrow 200-vote margin in 
Saturday's runoff election to capture 
the 31st District seat in the Texas 
Senate. Castro County favored Simp-
son by a 503-356 margin as 211/2  % of 
the county's registered voters cast 
ballots. However, Price received good 
margins in the northern counties to 
win a narrow victory as the district 
recorded a light 15% average turnout. 

mar pheasant hunt Home lighting 

Music associated with Christmas 
will be featured in the holiday concert 
of Dimmitt school bands and choirs at 
2:30 p.m. Sunday in the high school 
auditorium. 

Carols, hymns and popular selec-
tions will alternate on the program, 
climaxed by a combined number by 
the DHS Bobcat band and choirs. They 
will present "A Tribute of Carols." 

The public is invited for the concert, 
with admission prices at one dollar for 
adults and two dollars for family ad-
mission, according to Band Director 
Ralph Smith. 

Among numbers to be played by the 
Bobcat Band are "La Traviata," "Jin-
gle Bell Rhapsody" and "Joyance." 
The DHS Singers directed by Doug 
Morris will offer "A Christmas Hap-
pening." 

contest set 

DHS actors 

file appeal bonds. Most of those in the 
party of 12 were from Abilene or 
Lubbock areas, Cosper said. 

Arrests this year have been chiefly 
for killing hens, Cosper said, although 
in past years most of the charges have 
been hunting without a license or 
shooting from highways. 

Game wardens from other areas of 
Texas were assigned to this part of the 
state for the season opening, with two 
each in Castro, Deaf Smith and Par-
mer Counties. In addition, two super-
visors have assisted in Deaf Smith 
County, which has a larger area. 

give comedy 
A favorite of children for many 

generations, the exciting and hum-
orous tale of "Jack and the Beanstalk" 
in a dramatic adaptation will be staged 
by the Dimmitt High School drama 
department at 9 a.m. today (Thursday) 
and again at 7 p.m. Monday. 

The morning performance, repeat-
ing one already given on Dec. 12, will 
be for school children of the area, 
while the Monday show will be open to 
the public in the DHS auditorium. 

This is the first play to be presented 
by the drama students this year, and 
the first directed here by Nancy 
Shurbet, drama teacher new to the 
Dimmitt school system. 

A $25 gift certificate will be awarded 
again this year to the first place 
winner in the annual Dimmitt Cham-
ber of Commerce-sponsored Christmas 
home lighting contest, with the judg-
ing set for Saturday and Sunday 
nights. 

The second place winner will receive 
a $15 gift certificate, with a $10 certifi-
cate going to the third place winner. 

Those planning to enter the contest 
should call 647-2524 and give their 
name and address so the judges will 
be sure to come by. Rural residents 
are also invited to participate. 

The decorations should be com-
pleted before Saturday, and should be 
left lighted both Saturday and Sunday 

4, evenings. 

Tower discusses 
national issues 

While 30 or more Castro County 
farmers had a part in American Ag-
riculture's "Swarming" of the Texas 
state capital Saturday, another Dim-
mitt man was one of the speakers at 
the "Swarming" of Oklahoma City. 

Carl King spoke from the steps of 
the Oklahoma capitol building to num-
erous Oklahoma farmers gathered in 
sub-freezing weather. He was invited 
to speak as chairman of the Texas 
Corn Growers Association. Dan Nelson 
and Charles Nutt accompanied him to 
Oklahoma City. 

Telling the group that the TCGA 
cannot advocate the farm strike as a 
commodity group, King said its mem-
bers "sure sanction it" and its aims 
are those the corn growers have 
worked for the past few years. 

He urged farmers to unite in a 
common cause, by striking or at least 
cutting back on all acreage, not buying 
new equipment and not selling any 
more products than is absolutely nec-
essary. 

"We don't like the word 'strike', 
but that may be the only way to wake 
up our government to the farmer's 
cause," he said. It doesn't make any 
difference which administration is in 
Washington, they all want cheap food 
at our expense." 

King said farmers must demand 
farmer-controlled advisory boards in 
the US Department of Agriculture for 
lasting effect. He said emergency farm 
legislation backed by American Ag 
was introduced last week in both 
houses of congress, calling for 100 
percent of parity for farm prices and 
increased loan rates for farmers. 

"We farmers must help ourselves 
and all do our part," he said. "United 
we stand; divided, the whole US 
economy fails." 

"The realistic approach," the Dim-
mitt man commented, "is to cut back 
on acreage and try to stay in business. 
This way, we'll at least be around to 
farm another day, and our merchants 
will be able to stay in business, too." 

Hart greeting 
project starts 

The annual Christmas Greeting pro-
ject at Hart, which benefits the 
community cemetery fund, is in pro-
gress with contributions being re-
ceived this week at the Farmers State 
Bank. 

Residents of the community are 
asked to contribute the amount they 
would spend to send holiday greetings 
to friends who live there, and instead 
their greetings are conveyed in a 
listing in the Christmas edition of The 
Castro County News. 

New chairman 
in ARC post 

H. H. Carlile 
funeral service 
is held Tuesday 

Jerry Wilhelm has accepted the 
post of Castro County chairman for the 
American Red Cross, it was announc-
ed last week. 

He succeeds the late Robert Buntyn 
in the chairmanship, to head coordi-
nation of Red Cross activities in the 
county. 

'Water importation 
still 75 years away' 

Wieui 

One hunting accident which sent a 
man to the hospital for removal of 
birdshot from his head and face, and 
arrests of approximately 20 for game 
law violations were incidents of the 

^1977 pheasant season opening in Cas-
tro County. 

Bill Bayless of Lubbock was brought 
to Plains Memorial Hospital about 
11:30 a.m. Saturday, and later dis-
missed after removal of "eight or nine 
shots from the left side of his head and 
nose," according to the investigating 
officer from the sheriff's department. 
The deputy said Bayless' companions 

reported two or three hunters had 
fired at once when a bird rose. 

Bayless was a member of a party. of 
Lubbock men hunting on the Jim Rob-
ertson place near Hart. Robertson ac-
companied him to the hospital. 

Five men in another hunting party 
were arrested by game wardens and 
charged with killing pheasant hens, in 
the largest group haul made in this 
county. In all, Justice of the Peach 
Marshall Young says about 20 hunters 
have faced charges in his court, two of 
them for hunting before the season 
opened Saturday. 

The five arrests were made when a 
dozen hunters were found with 16 
hens in their possession. Chuck Cos-
per, resident game warden in this 
area, said two wardens, talking with a 
hunter they had stopped for a license 
check, learned of the group who had 
killed hens. 

The wardens went to a vacant house 
south of Hart, found one hen on the 
porch and six others on a table inside. 
They came to Dimmitt and obtained 
search warrants, then returned to the 
house accompanied by Young and 
made the arrests. 

Five of the men were charged with 
killing three hens each. In a justice 
court hearing, Young assessed each a 
fine of $120. 

The fines have not been paid, he 
said Wednesday, and the men may be 
tried in Castro County court or may 

[Readings recorded at 7 a.m. daily 
for the preceding 24 hours.] 

More than 40 gathered last Wednes-
day in the County Expo Building to 
hear US Sen. John Tower speak and 
answer questions on national defense, 
women's issues, taxes and the farm 
situation. 

Tower was in Dimmitt for a Town 
Hall Meeting to discuss current issues 
with his constituents and find out what 
issues most concern them. 

In his opening remarks, Tower said 
that he has a great deal of concern 
about the price/cost squeeze on farm-
ers and stockmen. He added that he 
has a special team investigating in 
detail why there have been many price 
increases to the consumer but not any 
increase in pay to the farmers and 
stockmen. 

He added that it is hard to de-
termine what the effect of the strike 
will be, "but it has certainly attracted 
attention." 

When asked how he felt about the 
recent National Women's Conference, 
which was held in Houston, Tower 
said he felt it was obvious that the 
gathering did not represent the ma-
jority of American women and that the 
resolutions they passed would not 
have much impact on legislation. 

Hi Lo 
Thursday 	  72 32 
Friday 	  56 8 
Saturday 	  36 8 
Sunday 	  47 13 
Monday 	  69 25 
Tuesday 	  73 29 
Wednesday 	  60 24 
December Moisture 	 0 
1977 Moisture 	 12.76 

GEOLOGIST DON SMITH 
. . . Town Hall speaker Monday night 

SIGNING WATER-SYSTEM CONTRACT—H. B. Jordan 
[left] of Amarillo, who installed Dimmitt's first water system 
in 1928, looks on Thursday morning as Mayor Elmer Youts 
signs the $682,026.80 contract for H. B. Jordan & Co., Inc.. 
to build the pipeline-and-pumping system that will connect 
Dimmitt's new well field six miles south to the city's 

"Water will be imported, but not in 
20 years—maybe in 75 years," Lub-
bock geologist Don Smith told those 
attending Dimmitt's first in a series of 
Town Hall Meetings Monday night. 

"Water will be imported when 
people are willing to pay the cost," 
Smith said. "It would be economically 
unfeasible if you depended on the cus-
tomer to pay the cost. But when it 
comes down to how agreeable New 
Yorkers would be to share the cost 
someday in order to have food, you get 
a new perspective on it. We have the 
climate, we have the land, but those 
can't be moved. Water can be mov-
ed." 

Smith said Castro County will have 
more irrigated land in the year 2000 
than any other county over the Ogalla-
la formation, and that more efficient 
pumping equipment will be the key to 
future success. 

"In my opinion, the crux of the 
situation is and will continue to be the 
efficiency of the well," Smith said. 

"I'd like to see some research on a 
cost-effective method of reconstructing 
these old, inefficient wells," he added. 

Smith showed 30 to 40 slides ex-
plaining the formation of the Ogallala 
aquifer 10 million years ago. 

Horace H. Carlile, 79, a resident of 
Dimmitt for 32 years, a theater owner 
and former president of the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce, died at Plains 
Memorial Hospital here just before 
midnight Sunday. 

Funeral services were conducted 
Tuesday afternoon in the First United 
Methodist Church by Ronnie Parker, 
Church of Christ minister, assisted by 
Rev. Marvin Roark, UMC pastor, and 
Bob Green, associate pastor. 

Burial in the Castro Memorial Gar-
dens was under direction of the Dennis 
Funeral Home. Serving as pallbearers 
were nephews of Mr. Carlile, and a 
group of friends acted as honorary 
pallbearers. 

Mr. Carlile, who resided at 710 W. 
Bedford, was a native of Franklin 
County. He married Celia Patton of 
Rotan in 1921 and they came to this 
county in 1945. 

He bought the motion picture thea-
ter located on East Bedford and op-
erated it until 1949, when he built the 
present Carlile Theater on South 
Broadway. 

Named Chamber of Commerce pres-
ident in 1952, he had been one of the 
group which formed the Dimmitt Pro-
duce Co. which was responsible for 
bringing vegetable packing operations 
to the city, and served on its board of 
directors. 

Survivors include his wife; a sister, 
Della Morrison of Abilene; 17 nieces 
and nephews. 

existing water system. City Manager Garnett Holland [right] 
witnesses the signing. The city received its $1.1 million in 
bond money last Wednesday to finance the project. Jordan 
said construction will begin about March 15, after materials 
have been accumulated and the danger of a freeze is past. 
The contract calls for completion within 250 working days. 

'Christmas Greeting' sign-up deadline is today 



Stairway to Fashion 
is having their 

1 Rack 	50% off 

364-7171 W. Park & Oak 
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15—LEGAL NOTICES I 15—LEGAL NOTICES  Bashttball calendar 
Mrs. Oscar Wylie of Dimmitt 
and paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Mit-
chell of Hart, 

DIMMITT 2:30—JV boys vs. Farwell in 
Springlake-Earth Tourney 

Monday: 
5 —JV boys vs Floydada, here 
6:30—Varsity girls, vs. Floyd- 

ada, here 
8—Varsity boys vs. Floydada, 

here 
Tuesday: 
5—JV girls vs. Abernathy, 

here 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Aber-

nathy, here 
8—Varsity boys vs. Aber-

nathy, here 

Mr. and Mrs. Ricky Mit-
chell of Hart are the parents 
of a daughter who was born 
Dec. 11 in Central Plains 
General Hospital in Plain-
view. She weighed 7 pounds, 
11 ounces and has been nam-
ed Lindy Rae. Maternal 
grandparents are Mr. and 

Photography by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

WEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS, TEXAS 

Box 484 	Phone 684-2535 

QUEEN of the Immaculate Conception Celebration Friday 
evening at the Immaculate Conception Catholic Church was 
Susie Flores, 8, who won the honor of crowning a statue of Our 
Lady of Guadalupe in a special ceremony before the celebration 
of mass. Miss Flores is the daughter of James and Lupe Flores 
and the granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Emilio Nino and Mr. 
and Mrs. A. C. Flores. 

Thursday: 
5:30—Varsity boys vs. Lov-

ington at Reese Air Force 
Tournament 

1-7th A boys vs. Hereford 
Stanton at Hereford Tour-
nament 

4:45-8th A boys vs. Plain-
view Blue at Hereford 
Tournament 

6-9th boys vs. Plainview 
Red at Hereford Tourna-
ment 

9:30-8th B girls vs. Farwell 
at Muleshoe Tournament 

8-9th girls vs. Levelland at 
Muleshoe Tournament 

Friday -Saturday : 
(Tournaments continue) 
Monday: 
4—JV girls vs. Vega, here 
5—JV boys vs. Vega, here 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Vega, 

here 
8—Varsity boys vs. Vega, 

here 
Tuesday: 
6:30—JV boys vs. Lubbock, 

here 
8—Varsity boys vs. Lubbock, 

here 
6:15 —JV girls vs. Monterey, 

there 
8—Varsity girls vs. Monterey, 

there 
HART 

Thursday: 
7—JV girls vs. Springlake- 

Earth at S-E Tournament 
8:30 —JV boys vs. Springlake- 

Earth at S-E Tournament 
7—Varsity girls vs. Olton at 

Olton Tournament 
8:30—Varsity boys vs. Olton 

at Olton Tournament 

Misses 
Perception 	1/3  off 
Jr. - Misses 	

i//?--: +0 
Dresses - Jumpsuits 

20% off 
z-4 

<4.1%Piet 
et irjr• elk: 

hcal 4 

Springlake, 

Springlake, 

Springlake, 

Springlake, 

FREE Gift Wrapping 

CONTRACTORS' NOTICE 
OF TEXAS HIGHWAY 

CONSTRUCTION 
Sealed proposals for mow-

ing and litter removal on State 
Department of Highway and 
Public Transportation Right of 
Way 

Maintenance Section 003 
Unit 1 

8 Ft. Strip Mowing 272 Acres 
Full Width Mowing 1,599 A. 
Litter Pickup 	1,599 A. 
Castro County, will be receiv-
ed at the District Office of the 
State Department of High-
ways and Public Transporta-
tion, P.O. Box 771, Lubbock, 
Texas 79408, until 9:00 a.m., 
January 4, 1978, and then 
publicly opened and read. 
The State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation, in accordance with 
the provisions of Title VI of 
the Civil Rights Act of 1964 
(78 Stat. 252) and the Reg-
ulations of the U.S. Depart-
ment of Transportation (15 
C.F.R., Part 8), issued pur-
suant to such Act, hereby 
notifies all bidders that it will 
affirmatively insure that the 
contract entered into pursuant 
to this advertisement will be 
awarded to the lowest res-
ponsible bidder without dis-
crimination on the ground of 
race, color, or national origin, 
and further that it will af-
firmatively insure that in any 
contract entered into pursuant 
to this advertisement, minor-
ity business enterprises will 
be afforded full opportunity to 
submit bids in response to 
this invitation and will not be 
discriminated against on the 
grounds of race, color, or 
national origin in considera-
tion for an award. Plans and 
specifications are available at 
the Maintenance Office for 
the above mentioned county 
and at the office of William 
M. Pope, Supervising Main-
tenance Engineer, 601 Slaton 
Road, Lubbock, Texas. 
Usual rights reserved. 

15-11-2tc 

CONTRACTORS' NOTICE 
OF TEXAS HIGHWAY 

CONSTRUCTION 
Sealed proposals for mowing 
and litter removal on State 
Department of Highway and 
Public Transportation Right of 
Way 

Maintenance Section 003 
Unit 2 

8 Ft. Strip Mowing 248 Acres 
Full Width Mowing 1,599 A. 
Litter Pickup 	1,599 A. 
Castro County, will be receiv-
ed at the District Office of the 
State Department of High-
ways and Public Transporta-
tion, P.O. Box 771, Lubbock, 
Texas 79408 until 9:00 a.m., 
January 4, 1978, and then 
publicly opened and read. 
The State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation, in accordance with 
the provisions of Title VI of 
the Civil Rights Act of 1964 
178 Stat. 252) and the Reg-
ulations of the U.S. Depart-
ment of Transportation (15 
C.F.R., Part 8), issued pur-
suant to such Act, hereby 
notifies all bidders that it will 
affirmatively insure that the 
contract entered into pursuant 
to this advertisement will be 
awarded to the lowest res-
ponsible bidder without dis-
crimination on the ground of 
race, color, or national origin, 
and further that it will affir-
matively insure that in any 
contract entered into pursuant 
to this advertisement, minor-
ity business enterprises will 
be afforded full opportunity to 
submit bids in response to 
this invitation and will not be 
discriminated against on the 
grounds of race, color, or na-
tional origin in consideration 
for an award. Plans and speci-
fications are available at the 
Maintenance Office for the 
above mentioned county and 
at the office of William M. 
Pope, Supervising Mainte-
nance Engineer, 601 Slaton 
Road, Lubbock, Texas. 
Usual rights reserved. 

15-11-2tc 

MAN is a creature who 
buys football tickets three 
months in advance, but waits 
until Christmas Eve to do his 
Christmas shopping. 

BEEF cattle may not be 
getting enough vitamin A in 
their diets this fall due to 
drought conditions and lack of 
green forage. So producers 
may want to supply a sup-
plemental source of vitamin A 
for cows since the vitamin is 
particularly important to re-
production and lactation. 

NO MATTER how much 
you try to improve Mother 
Nature, you can't fool Father 
Time. 

PRINCESS GUADALUPE at a special celebration at the 
Immaculate Conception Church Monday evening was Ramos 
Lopez. who is shown crowning the statue of Our Lady of 
Guadalupe. Following the crowning, mass was celebrated by 
Father Raphael Chen. Miss Lopez is the daughter of Ramona 
R. and George L. Lopez. The celebration observing the 
Immaculate Conception was coordinated by the church's 
Guadalupana Society. 

Monday: 
4-7th girls vs. 

here 
5-7th boys vs. 

here 
6-8th girls vs. 

here 
7-8th boys vs. 

here 
Tuesday: 
5:30 —JV girls vs. Lazbuddie, 

here 
6:30—Varsity girls vs. Laz-

buddie, here 
8—Varsity boys vs. Lazbud-

die, here 
NAZARETH 

Thursday: 
11:30—Varsity boys vs. Ab-

ernathy in Olton Tourna-
ment 

1—Varsity girls vs. River 
Road in Olton Tournament 

1—JV girls vs. Farwell in 
Springlake-Earth Tourney 

HOUMA TION NO TICE 

WHITE AUTO STORE in Dimmitt is being closed down. 

EVERYTHING in the store is being sold to the walls 

merchandise, automotive service equipment and fixtures. 

Everything will be sold by Saturday evening. 

Discounts range from 30 % to 50% off on all toys giftware 
Christmas items housewares —appliances TV sets 
stereo equipment tools guns fishing equipment 

sporting goods. 

Sale is limited to stock on hand. 

All sales cash all sales final. 
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DIMMITT 
SUPER MARKET 

109 Belsher Street, Dimmitt 	Store Hours: 7 a.m. 'til 9 p.m. 
We Give Double Gunn Bros. Stamps On Tuesdays And Wednesdays. 

SPECIALS GOOD DECEMBER 15 TIRO 21, 1977 

Extra Absorbent 

COCA-COLA 
6 Pack 	32 oz. 

$ 29 

7-UP 
OR 

	KIMBIESDaytime 24's  189 

CATSUP

Del Monte 

kil_TtEeflbiountk),fl 
HoNEy2s4u1B. e,:rsi 19  

32 Oz. 79' 
TAMALES Thoazr.dts 594  

PRESTONE ANTI—FREEZE Gallon  $329  

MARGARINE PARKAY Twsi°nft. 594 

GREEN BEANS Del  Monte Cut 16  Oz. 3 89' 
SWEET POTATOES 
CHICKEN BROTH 

HOLIDAY FOOD BUYS! 

APPLES --- 	37! 
TANGERINES --- 29c 

AVOCADOSLarge Caikmiac 
CELERY 	Large Stalk 	 27` 

39 
ONIONS 	Fancy Yellow 	 10!. 
'PIZZA ROLLSJ:r 2.89c 

3 $1 BROCCOLISpears 	For Top 

PIE SHELLS 	2 For 
DONUTS 
	

Downy noire 
Glazed or Jelly 

Maraschino 10 Oz. Salad Whitfield 
	

59' 
69' 
99' 
39' 
33' 
29' 

IP- 

CAKE MIX =zsw. .n 494  

TOWELS L:rrgaewn,You 2 For 1 
NI* 

Surgary Sam 30 

131/2  Oz. Sweet Sue 

°z 69' MAZOLA 01 oz Bothe 
19° CHERRIES 

59` 
$189  

MIXED NUTS- Oz. 
Torn Scott  994  CHOCOLATE CHIPS Baker's 12 Oz. 

SIRLOIN STEAK-AL:—$1" 
T-BONE STEAK "SDALCbh e $ 1 " 

BEEF LIVER Fre"k" Lb  39` PUMPKIN 	16 °z  

BAKER'S COCOANUT AroFzIake 

MARSHMALLOWS :rr,;„,ature 
CRANBERRY SAUCE clrosraY 

Del Monte 

HAMS Bo 
 

Armour 

1 89  Philadelphia 

	

CHEESE Kroft 
	C .3  

Old Engish 

CHEESE 5"19mr` 
Kraft Blue 	 4 Oz. 

CHEESE 79` 

	

DIPS Kroh 	c Pkg. 39 . o  

CHEESE BALL RECIPE 

24 ounces Philadelphia Cream Cheese 
2 5-ounce glasses Old English Cheese 
8 ounces Blue Cheese 
1 Tablespoon Accent 
1 Teaspoon Onion Salt 
1 Tablespoon Worchestershire Sauce 
3 Tablespoons Parsley Flakes 

Mix first six ingredients, make into ball 
and roll in parsley flakes and chopped 
nuts. 

CHEER 
,FaornLibly Size 

Box 
$399 

LOUR
5LIab.iBlag  594  

Our Darling 

CORN 17 Oz. 4 $1 00 

SPAN112ca°,199" 
Strawberry JAM 

2a 
imb  a.  994 	yioil 

TEA
Instant 	$ 49 
Lipton's 3 Oz. I 

\lb 

"Cti:31tEn  
TISSUE 

4 Roll 69 	r.   
011 , 
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immitt Business and Industrial Review 

See 

"There 

DIMMITT 

Reception 

induding 

An 

on 

Major 

Is 

Weather 

TV 

Cable 

on 8 

Net 

More 

CABLE 

channels 

works 

Channel 

TV" 

to I 

CO. 

, 

. 	
. 

-__. ....- 	:.. 	 .. , 	,, 	,. 	. 
vs  
v 	 -- — 

..... ..., , a I, is 
N", : , •):, $2299 	

Comforta.bly 
Casual 
for a traditional,. 
lifestyle. 
If you're a man whose 
tastes run to the classic. 	M 

traditional look, this Hush 
Puppies' casual is a fitting 
accessory. Subtle styling 

 . 	provides a comfortable con-
tidence—always right in 

.. 	•-..-:,-____-L.-----,f 	tune with your lifestyle. 

--- 	 And traditional in value. tool 

Mash 

P 	' 	'" uppu . s 

- 

.. 	- 

_........... 	... ,41----cift, 

All 

Mirro's 
stick 
design 
SilverStone 
vides 
cookware. 

MIRRO 
heats 
Flint
Antique 
covers 
convenience. 

lain 
pieces 

surface 

and 
-hard 

exteriors. 

of 	extra 

nonstick 

Rangeware 
cooks 

White 

available 

Higginbotham 

new rangeware 

resists 

porcelain 

and contoured, 
look 

SilverStone. 
represents 

long 

performance 

evenly 

with 

with 
a giant 

-wearing, 
scratching 

is heavy 

exteriors 
great and 

heatproof 

complementing 

for consistently 

-Bartlett 

DuPont 
step 

convenient 
and staining 

deserving 

gauge aluminum 

in 	Burnt 
clean easily. 

handles 

Antique 

SilverStone non- 

	

forward 	in the 
cookware. 

. 	. 	. 	pro- 
of 	the 	finest 

alloy. 	It 
superior results. 

Orange 	or 
Tight-fitting 
add to the 

White porce- 

Co.. 

Jarme Baker, Daughter 

Mr. 8. Mrs. James 

Visiting with 

Farm Bureau 
JACK W. FLYNT, 

Agency Manager 

304 N. Broadway 

of 

P. Baker 

Santa 

Insurance 
C.L.U. 

647.3420 

16523 	 Breathire Brushed 

Pig Skin ® 

Casual Shoes 

Dimmitt, 

Texas 

e- - 	
--) 

ft 
,...a/ 	jr,  

C 	Q 	ANTHONI ,e 	CO 

-7---- 
l 	 ) 

4310 BEET 
ONLY TWO IN STOCK 

Plus Freight "First 

-....., 

, 

	

ill 	, 	, 
.... 	' 	' 

	

1 ank-tww tem. 	v. 

Harvests three 20- 
inch rows. 

Big harvesting and 
Exclusive wheel elevator 
Beets can be deposited 

C & S EQUIPMENT 

to 

----, 

cleaning 

, 

,r,,  

..„- „ 

40-inch 

in 

Will 
Come 

,.. 
, 

„ 

A ' 

rows 

handles 
tank 

HARVESTER 

..•,..),.: 

capacity. 

Be Sold 
First 

, 
. 

_ad_ 

 movm, 

or 

beets 
or truck. 

At Cost 
Served" 

ei 

I 	4 
: 

, 	I 

,„ 	, 

II 

in C,Opo.SO, 

tour 20- to 30- 

gently. 

CO. 

. 	 • 	. 
• 

. 	
• 

. 	•: 	I 	
• 	• 	. • 

. 

• 
• • 	. 

• • 	. 
• '..-- 	

• 

• 
• 	• —r • 

 .-,-,-__ 

• ' 	,-... 
. 	' . 	. 	.. 

• 
When You Care Enough 

To Send The Very Best" 

We Have Got 

Will Get 

Or It's 

BALDWIN FILTERS 
Complete Line 

It... 

It... 

Not Made 

BCA BEARING 
Agi & Ind. 

20.99 

Polly 

DAYCO 

WEATHER 

201 

Industrial 

HYDRAULIC 
Complete 

& 

& 

G&G WELDASPROKET 

POPULAR 

E. 

Center 

DIMMITT 

BELTS 

Bedford- 

HEAD 

BEARING 

GRADE 

. 

. 

8: 

Weekend 

L&S 

LINK 
ROLLERCHAIN 

FARM 

INC. 
647-4128 

RC 

BOLTS 

945-2529 

BELT 

35-120 

BEARING 
& SEAL 

Joe Dee 

♦ / 
\ 

ON 

S 

Il . ) .1.. 
, 

1 

111.  

Revlon 

Moon 
Jontue 
Charlie 

[Womens 

Intimate 

• 

	

- 	i rr 
It 	, 	_ 	_ 

L 	I- 
t, 	(..---- 

Tr. 

, 
'V 

 

Fragrance] 

Drops 	 in 
Recall 

Prince Matchabelli 	Gary 
Wind Song 	 Fidji 
Cachet 
Aviance 	 Dana 

Tabu 
Charles Revson 	Ambush 
Cerissa 
Ciara 	 Jovan 

i -,, i 	Ultima 	 Musk 
......... 

Max Factor 	
Woman 

p_.:-,s4 	Stephan B 
Geminesse 	

Nina 
"L'Air 

• - 	, 	Khara 
Hypnotique 	

"Farouche" 

Maxi 	 (Mans) 

Chanel No. 5 	 Mon 

- 	
Chanel No. 22 

British 
Bitter _, - 	 Bravura 

-•  
-- _ 	

--__ 

4  
  r 	KODAK TRIML1TE 

28 

_.. .-'- ,,,.-",,., ...,•-• 

	

the fUn 	 , ,,,,„ 	dim ' g, 
-- 

	

an instant_ 	 ',:I. 
O•POIWO 

INSTAMATIC 

LaRoche 

Oil 

Ricca 
du Temps” 

Tromphe 

Sterling 
Lemon 

Musk 

Camera 
OuHit 

. ltoloro•ItC 
Cont. 

'\ r 

. Toroo.otornliol 

Coty Musk for Men 

Pierre Cardin 

Chanel for Men 

Old Spice 
Old Spice Musk 

Jovan 
Musk Oil 
Ginseng 
Man 

Faberge 
Brut 
Aphrodisia 
Woodhue 

Royal Pub 

Bacchus 

KODAK 
INSTAMATIC 

X•35F Camera 

.,.. 	, 	
outfit 'i4J.- 	•  

...--:w• 

• COS d•CloC 
474 4.PootOO Mote,  

41 rool MI In • Dual ..w.  

For 

And 
British 
Christmasgive 

everyday. 

Ster 
be with 

fin  ® g. 
him 

him 

MOBIL 

stop 

For your 

That's 

Gasoline, 

We 

NEW 

it is 

the 

service 

have 

PHONE 

SERVICE 

Wholesale 

647-5425 

Diesel, 

Mobil 
Ae 

We have 

at our 

place 

by ATURO 

a complete 

Oil 

that 

647-5996 

NUMBER 

and 

a 

you 

Mobil 

Ene 

STATION 

MENDOZA 

Greases. 

get 

of 

needs 

one 

call 

sera \ 

i '0 7  

11:4 

1,„4,,,,_-- 
Coty 

TlirotHlernoot • 25 nun 19 .5 roes • Elotit.. 	 to. One,. and n0.411 Nob • CornOtIno 
- 	- 	 bone, onoctor • Toon sone or cOlor eon 	 .41, 1,”, era 

coo 

• COoroptolo voto tdo, .1 Ottallash 

53.50 	 59.50 	 55.95 

Masumi 
Emeraude 

69.50 
KODAK TRIMLITE 
- 	INSTAMATIC 

------------ Imprevu 
Nuance 

k 
-•:. 

	

48 Camera 	 KODAK -, 	, 	 Outfit 
	

INSTAMATIC 
‘ 	ii -.. 	 X•15F Camera 

4r - 	' - 	 Outtil 
Smitty 
Wild 

Helena 
Heaven 
Courant 

Musk 

\ Rubenstein 	 x 
Sent 

?wo 

Th••• ••••. No. 

 ,. 	to  

	

(,-... 	.....-,.. 

:Kodak 
-QM 

o 
• 

lot Av.,. c 
• Coro. rarstemeir 'moue 
• Veep ra 7 ferret Lens • Fi.priym 

,.....30..i..-.....,,„,..,,,„, 
• Comets* .toe 

Rexaff 

, 	• 	- 	. 

	

a- 	• 

E4C1rOoto MAU, 

	

osposum cootr01 	 • No solboos to 

	

Noe ]IBM 	 eats ,vot ore moohotri 

	

ingtomoo 	 . Talmo cOtC0.1.603 04  >MONO, • En, &m- 

ern ono 	.o9as.  

	

132.50 	 24.95 

Dittij 

Available in gift sets or individual 
shave from $550, cologne from 

1)(1466415 Re  R 

gifts of after 
$6.50. 

Thug 

YOUNG 
• • is the time to start 

Cl savings account... 
Get a head start! The sooner 
you begin saving regularly 
the bigger your nest egg 
later! Open one of our high 
terest savings accounts today! 

First State 
of Dimmitt 

6474151 

• . 	. 
will be 

in- 

Bank 

, 

1 

Buy 

----ill 

UNTIL 

WAIVER 
FINANCE 
CHARGES 

now 

1* 

MAR. 

OF 

means 

,7ibviousiv. 

you buy 
charges 

the 

1, 

Waiver 
now. 

until 
sooner , 	you 	your 

1978 
of 'inane* simPir 

but pay no finance 
Marc', 1. 	1978 

bey 	new 

...., , 	,,..5. 	Ancot. 

• , 	. i 	-, 	,. .1k,  
"MINI-CHANGER" 

STEREO COMPACT 

or 

or 

113 

would 

the 

willing 
higher 

have 
today 
business 

their 
p•issible 

by 

made 

insurance 

Has 

E. 

It 
your 
Or, 

your 
injured 

To 
to 

You 
to let 
for 

Not 

booklet, 

INSURANCE 

coverage 

deductibles? 

insurance. 

Is inflation 

‘olurions 

your 

suppose 
car. 

help 

can't 

high 

business 

Bedford 

insurance 

person 

self insure 

it undermine 
a thorough 

altogether. 
companies companies 

home 

Could 

hold 

do 

Call 

BEHRENDS 

heavy 
your 

someone 

sued 

insurance 

or business 
coverage 

is 
your liability 

you for, 
down your 
your smaller 

much about 
your loss 

evaluation 

to blame 

One of 
candidly tells 

is Enough-  
for your 

too 

home, 

burned 

injured on 
coverage 

say, 5300,000 
insurance 

losses 

inflation. 
protection. 

of your 

Americas 
you other 
— along 

free (or, 

inflation 

in' surance 

pay for rebuilding? 

for 
rates? 

AGENCY 
647.3176 

dim n 

your 

rates, 
by taking 

But 

home, 

most 

today 

light. 

handle 

your 

car 
? 

tornorrim , 

property 
it 	if 

and wow' 
are you 

you dont 
Call us 
car and 

respected 
reasons in 
with 

Case tractor. the more you 

• 
— 	save on !manta charges. 

This offer applies to the 
Realistic® Clarinette® "20" 

... 	-:. 	 nurchinse of any new tractor 
C&Se rn die 	waiicimwea plays any size record on 

-.._ 	 line 	from 43 PTO TO out 

	

,.,,,...h.., Drive 	the . 	. 3-speed changer. With dust 
-- f 

ix • -... 	. „-. • 

a. 300 eilbere bli Case 2870. 

— 	
- 	

enY born the 
"tractor specfalists- 

mf. • 	the -finance 

l'' 	
specialists.' , 	and 

save. offer limited. SO . 	see your participating 
Case Divider todar „ 	...,... KILLINGSWORTH 

cover Phones jack. 

69" 

13-1166 

CASE POWER & EQUIPMENT 
120 E. Andrews 	 Phone 6474197 [1::::1 

BUILDERS' SUPPLY 
S. Hwy. 385 647.3141 



heat 
pump 

"THE ELECTRIC SAVINGS MACHINE" 

energy 
used 

is 
energy 

....saved 
S

ince the heat pump pull. much of its heat right out of thin air. it actually 
ayes energy as it works. In fact,the heat pump delivers as much as two units 

of heat for every one heat unit of electricity it uses. That's an efficiency story that 
no other system can equal. And the heat pump does it all in your own home 

without flame or water. Just electricity — pure and simple. 

SPS 
SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE 

OUR GENERATION IS FOR YOU ! 
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,flaysitio Ginn to try 

all-state Christmas party slated Friday 
By TEENY BOWDEN night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Doug Free-
man and Sonya of Jal spent 
Thursday and Friday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Hershel Wilson and 
Daneen. They spent Saturday 
and Sunday with the Bill 
Freemans of Earth. 

Dr. and Mrs. Bill Swan and 
children of Amarillo and Dr. 
and Mrs. W. J, Hill of 
Dimmitt were Sunday dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Win-
ston Waggoner and children 
and the men hunted in the af-
ternoon. The women and Judy 
and Giner Swan visited in the 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Brown and Lynn. 

Leland Ginn of Dimmitt 
High School earned the right 
to compete for All-State Choir 
when he placed second in 
auditions for All-Area Choir in 
Lubbock Saturday. 

Tryouts for the state choir 
will be held at Midland in 
January. 

"Ginn has a good chance to 
make all-state this year," 
DHS Choir Director Doug 
Henry said this week. "He 
placed fourth last year in try-
outs for all-area, and his sec-
ond place this year indicates 
improvement he 
the past year. 

has made in KEEPING IN PRACTICE 
.Leland Ginn will try out for All-state Choir 

Approximately 65 pictures 
were taken last Saturday and 
this Sunday by Gale Sadler at 
the community building, in-
volving 22 families. Santa was 
'Present Sunday to the delight 
of the children. The pictures 
will be back for the Christmas 
party Friday night. Bring a 
wrapped gift under $3 marked 
man, woman, youth or child 
and play games and visit. 
Santa will be there again to 
pass out the gifts off the tree. 

The Baptist Young Women 
had charge of the Foreign 
Mission Week of Prayer pro-
gram at the church Monday 

:and Tuesday morning with 
-Mrs. Lonnie Wilson in 
.charge. Baptist Men had 
charge of the Wednesday 
night program with Roy Phe-
lan in charge. Baptist Women 
tad charge of the program 
Thursday and Friday morn-
ings with Mrs. Roy Phelan in 
:charge. The church goal for 
the Lottie Moon Christmas 
offering is $2,373. The av-
erage attendance for the 
:Week of Prayer was seven. 

• 

VelWierCrefael k)reeredVa4sfah 

afternoon on the Christmas 
program scheduled for Sun-
day night at 7 p.m. 

The Springlake-Earth var-
sity team lost to Sudan 76-50 
Tuesday night. Clint Dawson 
led with 13 points and 5 re-
bounds. Hoby Matlock was 
close behind with 12 points 
and 9 rebounds. 

Kevin Riley and Rory Jones 
and the junior varsity won 
52-50 recently over Sudan. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Gil-
breath and boys attended the 
tournament at Sudan Satur-
day. Matt and the Dimmitt JV 
team won their first game and 
lost the last two games. 

David Ogas and the Dim-
mitt 7th grade B team won 
over Bovine 28-20 last Sat-
urday night. David was high 
point man in the game. 

• 
Mr. and Mrs. Jake King of 

Hereford visited Sunday after-
noon with Mr. and Mrs. 
David Sadler, Melody and 
Karla. 

Mr. and Mrs. Winston 
Waggoner, Quint, Holly and 
Gay attended a Christmas 
party in Amarillo Saturday 

Friday with her aunt Mrs. 
Allen Williams. 

• 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Phelan 

of Fieldton visited Monday 
afternoon and had supper 
with Mr. and Mrs. Roy Phe-
lan. 

Junior Sauseda is one of the 
67 WTSU students recently 
inducted into Alpha Chi. He is 
a pre-law student and has 
been on the Dean's honor roll 
each semester since he en-
rolled. 

Jeanne Haydon is one of 
the three nominees for band 
sweetheart for Springlake-
Earth. The band festival will 
be the 14th at 8 p.m. 

Kim Haydon and the 
Springlake-Earth Wolverines 
won over Sudan Tuesday 
night 57-43. 

Mrs. Ezell Sadler visited in 
Hereford with Mrs. Jake King 
Tuesday. 

The WMU Council met at 
the church Thursday morning 
following the Week of Prayer 
program, with Mrs. Thomas 
Parson in charge. 

Practice continued Sunday 

GIFT 
IDEAS 

FOR HIM Frio 
Frio club holds 
Christmas party Oso- 

de-•°6—v 
t 	 -t  

Men's Dress & 
SPORT SHIRTS 

Famous $797 	3 For 

Brand 1 $23°° Values to sir 

By MRS. OWEN ANDREWS 

The Adult I Sunday School 
class and the BYW had a 
Christmas party at the church 
Saturday night. Those present 
were Mr. and Mrs. Gale Sad-
ler, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Wei-
land, Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Bridges, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Sadler, Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Dean Carson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Bradley and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lonnie Wilson. 

Mrs. Cecil Curtis and Ray 
Joe Riley were among those 
attending the funeral of R. B. 
Dawson, father of Ed Dawson 
in Tulia Monday. 

L. B. Bowden, Ezell Sadler 
and Larry and David Sadler 
deer hunted in the Sheffield-
Ozona area Tuesday through 
Friday. They brought home 
five bucks and one doe. Larry 
got an eleven point buck. 

• 

	 0s44*- 
	Or  • --sius 

Frio Homemakers Club met 
Tuesday evening in the home 
of Mrs. Ronnie Hathaway in 
Hereford for the Christmas 
party. Assisting the hostess 
were Mrs. Harlan Barber and 
Mrs. Frank Robbins. They 
served special holiday foods 
and the president, Mrs. D. F. 
Yandell, was in charge of the 
entertainment time. Each per-
son gave details of "The first 
Christmas I remember, what I 
received" and "My expecta-
tions for this Christmas." 
Afterward gifts were given 
out from the tree, secret pals 
having brought gifts revealed 
identities. New pals were 
chosen for the coming year. 

Others attending included 
Mmes. Gary Hathaway, Bob-
by Kendrick, J. E. Warrick, 
Billy Warrick, T. L. Spark-
man, Eugene Baldwin, Jack 
Andrews, Annie Lee Dobbins, 
Johnny Tims, Weldon Steph-
an, Annie Springer, Gerald 
Harder, Jerry Richardson, 
Edgar Vinson, A. T. Jones, 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Phelan 
had dinner with the Loyd 
Morris family in Tulia Sunday 
to help him celebrate his 
birthday. 

Mrs. Ezell Sadler and Mrs. 
L. B. Bowden visited with 
Mrs. Cleasey Layman in the 
Lazbuddie community Wed-
nesday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Embree Roy 
Sadler visited in Lubbock 
Wednesday with Dr. and Mrs. 
Myles Sadler, Gregory and 
Amy. 

Mrs. David Sadler and her 
mother, Mrs. Jake King of 
Hereford, visited in Amarillo 

Pheasant hunting got off to 
El good start in the community 
Saturday. Hunters were ev-
erywhere. Dr. Myles Sadler 
and Gregory of Lubbock spent 
Friday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Embree Roy Sadler and 
bunted with Embree Roy and 
Gale Sadler Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Max Sher-
man Lynn and Holly of Ama-
1416, Mr. and Mrs. John Wil-
kerson, Ray and Sarah and 
Norton Baker and son Richard 
of Lubbock,' Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Haydon and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronald Cleavinger and 
Have had dinner with Mr. and 

Dress Belts 
By Lyntone 

$8.  
Our finest classic styles with the look 
that says quality of a moderate price. A 
variety of styles in Black or Brown. Sizes 
30-42. 

Owen Andrews, and Miss 
Alma Andrews. 

• 
Eighteen persons attended 

the Frio WMU program and 
luncheon Thursday, when for-
eign mission study was the 
subject. This is the emphasis 
time for the Lottie Moon 
Christmas offering for foreign 
missions. Participating in the 
program were Mmes. Earnest 
Harder, D. F. Yandell, Glenn 
Thomas, Eugene Baldwin and 
Owen Andrews. Mrs. Frank 
Robbins was in charge of the 
program and Mrs. Earl Har-
kins is WMU director. Food 
representative of Asian coun-
tries was brought by other 
ladies helping with the obser-
vance of mission week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley 
Brown have moved to Ama-
rillo after living several years 
at Park Rapids, Minn. She is 
the daughter of A. T. Jones 
and both are related to sev-
eral in the area. They lived in 
Dimmitt many years. She 
grew up in the Hereford area, 
attended schools there and 
they lived in this area several 
years before the time in Dim-
mitt. They are staying with 
their daughter Judy and her 
husband Sid Perkins in Ama-
rillo for the present time. Son 
Ronnie lives in Massachusetts 
with his family and the other 
daughter, Verna, lives in Min-
nesota with her husband Ron 
Griffith and children. 

• 

Mr. and Mrs. H. E. Lindley 
and their daughter Mrs. 
Christine Shirley visited Lind-
ley's niece Mrs. Carl Ridge-
way, Mr. Ridgeway and fam-
ily at Searcy, Ark. last week. 
They also visited others of the 
family who came from near 
Little Rock to be with the 
family group. 

Dimmitt man's 
father dies 	0) 

Funeral services for Robert 
Franklin Butler, 78, of Anton, 
father of Dean Butler of Dim-
mitt, were conducted Dec. 7 
in the First Baptist Church at 
Anton by Rev. Truitt White, 
pastor. Burial was in the 
Anton Cemetery. 

Pamper him this Christmas 
with Pajamas or a Robe 

Pajamas 

597  
Robes Reg. 12.99 

9 97 
Mr. Butler was a retired 

farmer who lived in Anton 40 
years. He was born in Jack 
County. 
His wife preceded him in 
death in 1975. 

Pallbearers included his 
grandson Gary Lynn Butler of 
Dimmitt, along with five other 
grandsons. 

Luxurious velour robes of 80% acetate and 20% ny-
lon. Solid color with contrasting trim. One size fits oll 
in Navy-Burgundy, Burgundy-Navy, Brown-Camel, 
and Camel-Brown. Under the robe wear a pair of 
pajamas of either 50% polyester-50% cotton, 65% 

polyester-35% cotton. Choose from 
solid color or fancy patterns. Sizes 
A-B-C-D. 

In addition to the son here, 
he is survived by two other 
sons, Doyle and Charles of 
Anton; three daughters, 
Christine Buchanan of Anton, 
Johnnie Knight of Levelland 
and Estelle Sladek of Taylor; 
12 grandchildren and eight 
great-grandchildren. 

OPEN 
THURS. & SAT. 
Til 9:00 p.m. 

iNatigr•i•Itefli,e4Mta?oltlet; 

Mrs. Ray Joe Riley, Kevin 
and Jodie and the men did 
some hunting. 

Bennie 	Bennett, 	two 
friends, and Travis Cowell, all 
of Amarillo, and C. B. Luns-
ford of Dimmitt hunted with 
Larry, David and Ezell Sadler 
and Randy Powell Saturday. 
Mrs. Cowell and Clara and 
Mrs. Lunsford, Stevie and 
Randy also had dinner with 
them and visited in the after-
noon with Mrs. Larry Sadler 
and girls. 

Mrs. Floyd Ivey was honor-
ed with a birthday party in 
her home Monday afternoon 
by the birthday club. Those 
present were Mrs. Roy Phe-
lan, Mrs. Lillie King, Mrs. 
Lloyd Blanton, Mrs. R. V. 
Bills and Mrs. J. E. Shirey of 
Earth. Mrs. Cecil Curtis came 
back by after the funeral in 
Tulia. 

• 
The Flagg 4-H Club had 

their Christmas party and 
supper in the courthouse com-
munity room Monday night 
and went caroling and had a 
hay ride. Those present were 
Hal Gilbreath and his parents, 
Quint, Holly, and Gay Wag-
goner and their mother, Todd 
and Tracy Hatla and their 
parents, Scott, Laura and Le-
sa Nelson and their mother, 
Ben Ray Holcomb and a 
guest, Lynna McGuire, David 
and Gabriel Montiel. 

Mrs. Cyble Gamblin of Sun-
ray visited Monday and Lies-
day with her daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Kim Williamson and 
Shawna and Mrs. V. E. Bear-
den of Hart. Mrs. Ruth Spen-
cer also visited with them. 

Mr. and Mrs. Noah Spencer 
spent the weekend with Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Spencer in 
Red River. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Par-
son and children took her 
mother Mrs. Ellis Wilson to 
her home in Azle Saturday 
and returned home Sunday 
afternoon. 

illllllllllllllll 

Teas Office Of Traffic Safety 



NACHURS 
THE PROFESSIONALS 
in Liquid Fertilizer 

Pioneers in the Foliar Fertilizing Industry 

Celebrating 31 years of service to agriculture. 

(1946-1977) 
'Delivery 

"Free Soil Analysis 

"Free Leaf Analysis,  

"Storage 

"Row Feeding 

vw Complete Program 

CLUCK FERTILIZER 647-3121 	RONNIE GRIFFITH 647.2467 	JERRY CLUCK 6474662 

NANCHURS Yibilt  
A DIVISION Of NA•CNURS Lanotalional 

4 Meets S 2.500 reversentoteees ear the naticei to serire to • Manor Ohio • London. °nue°. cad., • Red Oak, loge • Forrest City, Arkertsas 
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Hart citizens 
begin study 

Basktball 
scorn 

Thursday, December 15, 1977  "••71. 

School board moves 
spring holiday date 

Cats drop 
tight game 

DIMMITT 
Varsity boys 65, Lubbock 68 
JV boys 29, Lubbock 61 
Varsity boys, 56, Tulia 48 
JV boys 54, Tulia 33 
Varsity girls 65, Tulia 57 
JV girls 29, Tulia 26 

The board approved the 
sale of two used buses and 
will take bids on replace- 	6 
ments. 

Sudan Tournament 
JV girls 39, O'Donnell 33 
JV girls 53, New Home 64 
JV girls 59, Cotton Center 44 

(third place in tourney) 
JV boys 63, O'Donnell 42 
JV boys 54, New Home 65 
JV boys 36, Wilson varsity 37 

41 

.11 

HOSPITAL NEWS 

WP AWARD WINNERS at the Dimmitt Young Fanners-Young Homemakers 
annual awards banquet Saturday were Arlie Petty, Star Young Farmer, whose 
award was accepted by his wife, Doris [left]; and June Sutton [right), Outstanding 
Young Homemaker. 

Tulia Tournament 
Varsity girls 49, Lockney 56 
Varsity girls 72, Farwell 33 
Varsity girls 57, Friona 38 

(won consolation) * 

'77 winners named 
at YF-YH banquet 

Muleshoe Tournament 
9th boys 40, Olton 35 
9th boys 46, Muleshoe 47 
9th boys 24, Morton 57 

(fourth place in tourney) 
8th B boys 5, Littlefield 38 
8th B boys 34, Farwell 31 
8th B boys 33, Tulia B 19 

(won consolation) 

The Dimmitt Bobcats 
fought Lubbock High's Class 
AAAA Westerners down to 
the last half-minute at Lub-
bock Friday night, with the 
lead changing hands 12 times 
in the final quarter, before 
taking the short end of a 68-
65 battle. 

Lubbock held the lead dur-
ing the last three minutes, but 
with only 18 seconds left, 
Rocky Rawls drove in for an 
easy layup that cut the West-
erners' margin to 67-65. Lub-
bock added another free shot 
in the last 7 seconds for the 
final total. 

Dimmitt was leading 34-32 
at the half after trailing 15-8 
after one quarter. When the 
last frame began the score 
was 48-43. 

The Bobcats displayed a 
balanced scoring attack in 
which all five starters scored 
in double figures. Dennis 
Veals led with 16 points fol-
lowed by Bradford with 14, 
Summers 13, Rawls and Bell 
10 each. Rawls led in re-
bounds with 7 and credits, 14. 

The loss leaves Dimmitt 
with an 8-2 record for this 
season. 

Dimmitt's junior varsity al-
so lost at Lubbock, 61-29. 
Steve Stone with six points 
topped the Dimmitt scoring. 

*A 

• • • 
I 
• 

7th A boys 41, Muleshoe 13 
(Record: 5-0) 

8th A boys 38, Muleshoe 18 
(Record: 5-0) 

9th boys 42. Muleshoe 38 
7th girls 19, Muleshoe 23 
8th girls 20, Muleshoe 13 
7th B girls 2, Muleshoe 2 
8th B girls 2, Muleshoe 0 
9th girls 34, Muleshoe 15 

(Record: 5-0) 

ant, while Jerry Marvin, Teddy Smith-
son and Johnny Davis were given 
ribboned hammers for being handy 
husbands. 

Rex Lust, president of the Young 
Farmers, served as master of cere-
monies. Mrs. Bryant gave the wel-
come and a Christmas story was read 
by Rhonda Wise. Door prizes were 
donated by several Dimmitt business-
es. 

Bill Sarpalius of Hereford was the 
speaker for the evening. He is the 
manager of State Speaker of the House 
Bill Clayton's traveling office. 

iets 

• 

Varsity boys 41, Happy 65 
Varsity boys 44, Hale Cen. 69 

(fourth in tourney) 
Varsity girls 57, Lazbuddie 34 
Varsity girls 71, Springlake 70 

(won in overtime) 
Varsity girls 62, Hale Cen. 60 

i won championship, two 
all-tourney) 

op 

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL: 
G. S. Armstrong 
Manuela Beltran 
Josephine Bradford 
Leora Calhoun 
Martina Garcia 
Cleo Guerra 
Mary James 
Dora Johnson 
Choc Lay 
Odie Moore 
Gladys Morris 
Beulah McMurry 
Ada Nelson 
Janie Perez 
Maria Reyes 
Maria Rios 
Manuel Rodriquez 
Angela Ross 
Modesta Sandoval 
L. A. Tucker 
Jerrold Welborn 

PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
L. C. McLain 
John Cox 
Althea Hutchison 
Ora Nunnally 
Esther Thomas 
Rafael Enriquez 
Ethel Womack 
Modesta Sandoval 
Rachel Ramirez 
Frank Garcia Jr. 
Natividad Ortiz 
Chris Rodriquez 
Christina Presas 
Alicia Rodriquez 
Clarence Kern 
Pearl Gass 
Amelia Perez 
Lucy Garcia 

The school calendar was al-
tered to set the spring va-
cation ahead a week, and a 
textbook selection committee 
was appointed at the Monday 
night meeting of the Dimmitt 
Independent School District 
board of trustees. 

The spring holiday week 
was originally set for May 5-9, 
Supt. Robert Ryan said, to 
coincide with the prospective 
date of the Bobcat Band's an-
nual trip. Instead, the band 
trip has been approved for the 
week of April 28-May 2 so the 
vacation period was moved to 
that time. 

That change necessitated 
moving the final in-service 
training day for teachers from 
May 4 to April 27, Ryan said. 

The textbook committee 
will review, by subject areas, 
books on the state adoption 
list and recommend to the 
board in March the texts to be 
chosen for use in Dimmitt 
schools next term. 

From the administrative of-
fice, Ryan, Evie Froehner and 
Johnny Mason were appoint-
ed. 

Teachers on the committee 
are Charles Grisham, litera-
ture, 7th grade; Zelda Ellison, 
literature, 8th grade; Shott 
Miller, Texas history; Sue 
Broderson, English grammar, 
9th grade; June Parker, Eng-
lish grammar, 10th, and 
Spanish I; Zona Vilas, English 
grammar 11th; Janet Mann, 
English grammar 12th. 

Also Nancy Shurbet, drama 
I; Avis Smith, free enterprise; 
J'Lynn Ryan, business sub-
jects; Ed Hickman, driver ed-
ucation. 

Citizen of year 

nomination open 

NAZARETH 
Jr. high girls 35, Walcott 14 
8th boys 27, Walcott 12 
Varsity boys 50, Vega 54 
Varsity girls 57, Vega 37 
JV boys 23, Vega 46 
JV girls 30, Vega 20 

SPORT SHACKS INC. 
MINNESOTA STATE FRANCHISE REG. NO. 129 

Sport Shacks Inc., a chain of 92 
sporting goods stores and'clealers has 
franchised Sport Shack dealerships 
available throughout the state of Texas, 

1 per county. Investment $1000. For 
more information write Sport Shacks 
Inc., Rt. 2, Box 349, Lindstrom, MN 
55045. 

7th girls 21, Bovina 28 
7th boys 29, Bovina 27 
8th girls 29, Bovina 12 
8th boys 44, Bovina 33 

Canyon Girls Tournament 
Jr. High girls 29, Vega 20 
Jr. high girls 34, Canyon 21 
Jr. high girls 13, Valley 17 

Isecond place) 
7th boys 16, Kress 30 
8th girls 29, Kress 13 
8th boys 24, Kress 40 

rt 

DR. JEFFERY W. Savell is 
the new meats specialist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex-
tension Service, assuming the 
position vacated by Woodrow 
Bailey who retired recently. 

June Sutton was named Outstanding 
Young Homemaker and Arlie Petty 
was named Star Young Farmer at 
Saturday's annual Dimmitt Young 
Farmers-Young Homemakers award 
banquet in the First United Methodist 
Church dining hall. 

The winner of each award is chosen 
by vote of the members of each club. 

In addition, each club named its 
most hardworking member-Glenn 
Schumacher for the Young Farmers, 
and club President Vicki Bryant for the 
Homemakers, who also named Karen 
Robertson as the hardest working new 
member. 

The Hardluck Young Farmer award 
was presented by Alfred Sammann, 
who quipped, "We started to give it to 
the whole chapter." It was given to 
Dana Wall. Mrs. Sutton was named 
the Pot-luck Young Homemaker, after 
an accident she had with a slow cooker 
full of beans. 

A gift was presented to the Young 
Homemakers' little sister', FHA 
member Amy Merritt. Tommy Ken-
worthy was recognized as the Out-
standing FFA senior boy. 

The past presidents of both clubs 
were presented with gifts, a gas grill 
for Ray Bradley and a memo pad/ 
plaque for Susan Harmers. 

Winner of the Homemakers Hus-
band of the Year award was Mike Bry- 

In the wake of a recent school bond 
election at Hart, which failed to pass 
by a majority of 242 to 173, a citizens 
committee was formed Monday and 
defined its purpose, "to examine the 
needs for building construction in the 
Hart Public School system, and report 
its findings to the board of education." 

Harold Bob Bennett was elected 
chairman of the committee which in-
cludes Myrt Leman, Marguerite Mc-
Lain, Margaret Morrison, Charles 
Black, David Nelson, Deryl Clevenger, 
W. T. King, Doyle Davis, Shirley 
Brooks, Edna Kittrell, Elias Martinez, 
Carol Mancias, Trannie Mapp, Larry 
Lee and Bobby Reed. 

After organizing, the committee met 
with the school board at its Monday 
night session. Board President Way-
mon' Foster and School Supt. Ted 
Averitt answered questions asked by 
members concerning the proposed 
$400,000 building program which vot-
ers 'rejected in an election Nov. 29. 

That program called for a school 
auditorium, a kindergarten building 
and other classroom space, and re-
moleling in the elementary school 
building. 

The citizens committee is asking 
residents of the Hart ISD to express 
opinions to any member of the com-
mittee or of the school board. 

IA other action Monday night the 
schDol board: 

-"Set Friday, May 19 as the high 
school graduation date, and May 23 
for 'the eighth grade graduation. 

Appointed a committee to select 
and recommend to the board textbooks 
for bse in the school system next year. 
MeMbers are Averitt, Principal Ed 
Arrtmons, Deanne Vance, Lynette Al- 
lison, Ann Burkhalter and Diana Long. 

-Heard Kent Kelly present plans 
for-installing lights on the school ten-
nis:courts, a project approved some 
time ago. 

=Voted to follow the recommen-
dation of Paul Lyle, school attorney, 
and adopt the Texas Association of 
School Boards' plan of group unem-
.plokment insurance, paying $45 per 
employee of the system. 

Bobcats enter 
RAFB tourney 

The Dimmitt Bobcats will participate 
this year for the first time in the Reese 
Air Force Tournament, to be held this 
weekend in the gym at the base near 
Lubbock. 

HART 
Varsity boys 39, Nazareth 59 
Varsity girls 47, Nazareth 88 
JV girls 22, Nazareth 47 

Ballots sent today 

for chamber board 

'44 

• 

ANYONE who tells you that 
he enjoys a cold shower every 
morning will lie about other 
things, too. 

Springlake-Earth Tournament 
Varsity boys 62, Lazbuddie 48 

Nominations for Dimmitt's 1977 
Citizen of. the Year are requested by 
Chamber of Commerce directors, with 
Jan. 10 set as the deadline. 

From those nominated, a recipient 
will be chosen for the honor desig-
nation at the annual Chamber banquet 
in January. 

Nominations are to be made by 
letter, giving the name of the nominee 
and why that person is worthy of the 
annual award. The letters must be in 
the Chamber office no later than 5 
p.m. Jan. 10. Any resident may nom-
inate either a man or a woman. 

The title for 1976 was awarded to 
Bill Behrends. 

wattapariwammwommtmistiammownmpas,mworwoomm 
Also from District 3AA, Morton will 

be an entrant. Its games are scheduled 
in a different bracket so it is possible 
there will be a prevue of district action 
should the Bobcats meet Morton in a 
clash for third place or the champion-
ship, or if their luck is worse, in the 
first round losers' bracket. 

Fire calls 

Dimmitt's first game will be at 5:30 
p.m. Thursday against Lovington, 
N.M. Loser and winner there will meet 
their counterparts from the Morton-
Big Spring game to be played earlier. 

Winners there will advance to a 
game at 5:30 p.m. Saturday, and the 
championship event will begin at 8:30 
p.m. The losers will play et 11:30 a.m. 
Saturday and their finale is set for 2:30 
pan. 

Dimmitt firemen were called to the 
Charlie Hestand residence last Thurs-
day, when a blaze started in a store-
room. Considerable smoke damage 
was done, and a wall in an upstairs 
apartment over the storeroom was 
burned. 

A call to the Elmer Schulte home 
northwest of Nazareth Saturday re-
sulted from a smoke detector alarm. 
No fire was found and it was de-
termined that a small amount of smoke 
from lint in the heater probably set off 
the alarm. 

OPEN HAYS 

PARTS NAYS 
Thursday, Friday and Saturday 

Other entrants in Dimmitt's bracket 
are Abilene Cooper and Dunbar; those 
in Morton's bracket are El Paso 
Address and Lubbock. 

HEALTH studies show that single, 
widowed and divorced people are far 
likelier prey to disease than married 
folk. 

Six Dimmitt people have been nom-
inated by the Dimmitt Chamber of 
Commerce board as possible suc-
cessors to four outgoing directors. 

The nominations will be sent to all 
chamber members for them to vote on, 
with the ballots being mailed out yes-
terday and today (Thursday). 

Nominees are Fred Annen of A&H 
Supply, Randall Craig of Craig Real 
Estate and Cowen Insurance Agency, 
Bettye Huckabay of Huckabay Ab-
stract Co., Al Jackson of Cobb's, Dr. 
James Sims, dentist, and Doug Lapins 
of Amstar Corp. The four chosen will 
succeed outgoing directors Bob Cad-
dell, Bill Clark, Doug Lapins and 
Robert Ryan. 

"The ballots need to be returned to 
the chamber office by Dec. 23," 
Chamber President Walt Hansen said. 
"We should have them tallied by Dec. 
28." Dec. 15, 16, 17 	8 to 6 

* Free Gifts 

* Favors for the Kids 
* Special Bargains on 

Tools, Parts, Accessories 

* Free Coffee, Soft Drinks, 

Doughnuts, Cookies 

We're holding an open house to thank the customers 

hz 	we've had since we assumed ownership of the Parts Haus, f,, 

to meet new friends, and to extend season's greetings to you. I 

t.  Everyone is invited and welcome! 

t 
i? 

i The Parts Haus fa 

4. 	 Zan• Ellison, Owner-Manager  
114 N. Broadway 	 647.3463 	1 

F Wendell Berdine 	 Mike Templeton  

OMIWOMMWAVAIttftlIafientftWAUMIMMIWSWIRWRINICOMPARIVAMOWt I 



DICroutiT (ENTER 
In Bearden Shopping Center 	Phone 647-3158 

Mon. thru Fri. 9:00 a.m. to 7:30 p.m. 

Saturday 9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. 

PRESTO BURGER 1 
Featuring Liddle Griddle 

$899 

NEW 

BOLD 3 
Detergent 

Plus Fabric Softener 
Giant Size 

$ 33 

REMINGTON 
SHELLS 

12 Gauge 6 Shot 
Reg. 94° 

awrcup $4,19 
by CLAIROL 

Mist 	$ 
Stying Wand 	1697  

Reg. '19" 

as, 

NOVELTY 
WALL 

PLAQUES No. 6-11 

Six Pack 
Returnable qts. 

Reg. '1" 99`  
WOODEN ARTISTS FRAMES 

Mini Gallery Selection 
Different Sizes, Wide Selection 

EVEL KNIVEL 
C B VAN 

Hear Evel Talk To 
Al His Good Buddies 

Reg. '15" 

EVEL KNIVEL 
STUNT CYCLE 

With Gyro Powered Motor 

Your 
Choice 

FREE 
JOY 

Detergent For Dishes 

$ 79 

Buy 48 oz. at $1" 

Receive 12 oz. 
FREE! Reg.  qv 

Your Choice 

20% off 
,00 oNor 

„, ; 0 
‘11.0 

ALL GAMES 
8, PUZZLES 

DICKIES 

INSULATED 

COVERALLS 

Fully Lined 

Final Reduction 

$1997  
Save $500  
Per Pair 

Galvanized Steel 
TRASH CANS 

50 Gallon 
Reg. '6"$399 

Borden's 

ICE CREAM 
1/2  Gallon 

BORDEN 
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Tour
choi 	

c Choice 

HERE'S SANTA 	••4 
i ' with an avalanche of

A - lig 

IChristmas Gift Ideas.4  St5- 
0 Le, 
wig 

Mrs. Baird's 

SNACK CAKES 
ALL 
SACK CANDY 

Reg. 59' 37c FINEST VEGETABLE SI1011(mt 

Specials Good December 14 Thru 21, 1977 CRISCO 
3 1. Can Shortening 

69 

0 
Mid or Hot 

FARMLAND 
SAUSAGE 

1 b. Bulk 87c  
BORDEN 

EAGLE BRAND 
CONDENSED MILK 

14 oz. 	C 

SPARTUS ELECTRIC 
CLOCKS 

Many New Styles 
To Choose From 

Just brig 

TT 
1)-11 

starting 
fluid 

PRESTONE ENGINE 
STARTING FLUID 

15 oz. 79  
Spray 

Reg. 93` 

eel/Rubber Maid 
CUTLERY TRAYS 

Keeps Sivenvare Stored 
No. 2922 $129 
Reg. '1" 

HAND TOWELS 

WASH CLOTHS 

'Ai"  200/ Match 	.0 

Your Choice 
Cannon or Lady Perrerell 

BATH TOWELS 

SUNBEAM ELECTRIC 
SLICING KNIFE 
A Great Gift 

For Dad 

$16 :P:  99v "  .vvrAfootts„ 	 Reg. '2" Now 

NORELCO'S GUN 

COMPACT DRYER 

7:71:t7 $ 1 797 
oir0 

Now 

PYROIL 
CONCENTRATED 
INDSHIELD DE-ICER 
Reg. 

79c 
12 oz. 

SPTGY Can 

STERNO 
LOGS 

6 Logs 5 In. ea. 
Easy Light 

$577  
Reg. 

20% 
OFF 

BUBBLE UP At 1 

CUTEX 
OILY 

POLISH 
REMOVER N' 
8 oz. Size 

Reg. 87` 

9c 
ALL WINTER 

CAPS & HATS 

Save  25% 

your car by 
the store to ciain your prize/ 

THIS WEEKS LUCKY BUMPER STICKER NUMBER IS 6311 I 

Ponds Greaseless Whipped 

MOSTURIZER 
4.25 oz. 

Ponds 

COLD CREAM 
4.25 oz. 

39  
Reg. '1" Sell 

$1 19 
Reg. '1° Sell 

Flex Balsam & Protein 

CONDITIONER (30' off Label) $ 1129 
Reg. '1° Sell 16 oz. Regular or Extra Body 

Personal Touch 

RAZORS 
By Shick 

$127 
Reg. '1" Sell 

Arid Extra Dry 	6 oz. No Fluorocarbon 

ANTI-PERSPIRANT $179  
Regular or Unscented 	Reg. '2" SeN 

Denture Cleanser Tablets 

EFFERDENT 
96's 

	 (30` off Label) $1 59 
Reg. sr Sell 

Antiseptic Mouthwash 	

$ 	19 LISTERINE 
Reg. '1" SeN 24 oz. 

Hoover Celebrity II 

VACUUM CLEANER 
20% 	With Powermatic Nozzle 

OFF G.D.P. 
	

$8999  

RIVAL CROCK POT 	, 	 
With Removable 
5 qt. Stoneware 

Mod& $ 	99_4  
look 

 
3350 

'CY 

"Just Arrived" 

Childrens 8 Babys 

WINTER 
COATS 

1% OFF 



$1088  

E ELI ag 

ity  
111111111111 

TABLE & CHAIR °,,1  

64 
SET 	 The Six Million Dollar Man 

00 tk' 

40-Piece 

INNKEEPER 

HOME HOSTESS SET 
8-7oz., 8.9 oz., 8-12 oz., 

8.16 oz., 8.7 oz., glasses 

Reg. $13.88 Now 
DOLL 

Reg. $9.88 Now 

Rog. $10.88 Now $ 988 

fl g 
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rr 0 Sr  4111( 

112 S. Bdwy 	 Dimmitt, Texas 	 Phone 647.4440 

Store Hours: 	Mon.-Fri. 8:30 a.m. to 8 p.m. 	 Sat. 8:30 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD THRU SATURDAY, DECEMBER 24, 1977 

CFECK YOUR CFRISINMS USE.. 
CEECK  TI-ESE GIFT VAWES.. 

,a6 00 	 MEE =LA. 

Holiday 

CHOCOLATES 
4 lbs. Reg. $6.97 

Delicious assortment of dark and 
milk chocolate-covered centers 
Holiday Boxed. 

DOLL COACH 
No 5059 

Reg. $7.99 Now 

SANTA 
STORY 

BANK 

$10 Rolls of Candy Per Book 

88c 

Chidren's 

Reg. $6.97 Now $ 59 

80 

SILVER 
ICICLES 
SHIMMERING 
LIGHTWEIGHT 
1000 Flameproof 
Strands Per Box. 

ONLY 

$888 

c°74Clegaft°, 
uto,n s  

0 401%. 
6*'9W-4 

35 Miniature 
LIGHT SET 

Badminton Reflectors. 
2-Way Flasher. 

1.88 SET 

LITE BRITE 

$699  

50 Miniature 

LIGHT SET 
Badmilon %Rectors 

2-Way Rather 

2.67 SET 

  

MINUTE BURGER 

STEREO 

HEADPHONES -4°:: 

No. 338 

°V4) 
cac$41.r4k, 

°V;PI4 

SOUNDESIGN 

THE 

MONSTER GAME 
by Ideal 

THE SHELL 

COLLECTION 

Reg. $4.47 Now 

8 pc. Snack Set by Anchor Hocking  

370. 

TORY 

TURBO 

HAIR DRYER 

1200 Watt 

$ 1 088  

by Hasbro 

Reg. $9.99 Now $ 866 

THE SHRIMP 

by Northern 

$1099  

$999 
by Presto 

$799 

JUST RECEIVED 

Midland CB's 

40 Channel No. 77-882 	11 

$5788  
Namiton Beach 

DOUBLE MAC 

FAST COOKER 

Fry Baby. 

DEEP FRYER 
Servings in $ 1 499 
minutes! 

A•VnelmrtvntrAIMI AVIAVAltAtrAVAIMUNt'5A;MimewAirAVI3litMArAl 

by Fisher 

$ 1 3 88  

PLAY FAMILY 

LIFT & LOAD DEPOT 

$1988  L. 	Prepares 1-2 

	

1 	— II 
air:I=Eiza 

PRESTOI  

	

F.01 	111 

Imperial 

COOKWARE SET 

Staiiless Steel by Regal 

$ 2 299 



• co 
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gL Tr at Pite•ChttiSro,"1.434-GcteePitize4—: 

g oo. 

3 3 

SKI 3 

JACKETS 

GIFT 
WRAP 

OPEN 'TIE 9 P.M. EACH NIGHT 'TIE CHRISTMAS! 

SPECIALS GOOD THRU SATURDAY, DECEMBER 24, 1977 

BRACH'S 

CHOCOLATE COVERED 
WRAP IT PRETTY! MEDALLION CHERRIES YOUR 

CHOICE Jumbo Roll foil or 
Paper wrap. 26" wide. 
Foil 18 sq. ft., paper 

7 
50 sig. ft. Asst'd colors • 	

,
& designs. 	 EA.  

3-Roll Foil or Paper 
Gift wrap. Asst'd colors I. 
designs. Foil has 15 sq. ft. 
Paper 36 sq. ft. Both 26" wide. 87; for 91/2 oz. 

I'' 

SATINETTE 
RIBBON 

"x32'.Assorted 
colors. .5 7 Nylon 

I.; 

SOUNDESIGN 

8-TRACK PLAYER 
THE FRESH BRUSH t% GREEN 

SLIME Reg. $26.88 Now 	g The Cordless Skin Cleanser 

by Northern 

7630 

o*% MINIM/16N 
by Mattel 

CASSETTE RECORDER 

ec,
Aaoc wen boll-in 

~ ~ 	denser mike 
Battery or Electric 

Reg. $28.99$ 2688 
Now 

$799 '9 
PLAY DOH 

t Modeling 

Compound 

a. 	 

Men's Quilted 

WORK 

JACKETS g 
• 

*T- 0.4 
Reg. $24.88 Now 	g 

Oo 

99° 

t Final Closeout of 

1789 

CELLO g 

TAPE I 
1/2.. in. 

40 

6/143140,,, • • 

Cottons & Blends 

t FALL 

!FABRICS 

I 

stegitw4kamikw 

Reg. $1.39 Now 

991 
zerztt vaiwtI

80 
 Athak.. °! Wriwr 	ri-gSt4Terg:; 

SPRAY 
SNOW 

Looks realistic. 
White. 13 0.. 

SNOW WHITE'S 

TALKING 

MAGIC MIRROR 
$888 

FLOATING 

CANDLES 
Crystal Gloss & Golden 
Pedestal Base 

$988 

WitksidWitttAWAEW4tife4t1JA hIAIIIAWAGO4ESAUVetWFWEVAtatAtWdant-lAW 

.63 Reg. $10.88 Now 

$2088 6 
With Speakers 

$ 5 999 

KOSS STEREO 

HEADPHONES 
No. K/61.0 

Volume Control on Each Earphone 

Reg. $29.88 Now 

$2588 

DAK 

HOT LATHER 

DISPENSER 

$777 

HEAVY STEEL 
RED WAGON 

With 81/2" vibe. 

$ 388 
FIRE RED 

TRIKE 
With chrome lenders a 
handlebar. Red streamers and 
grips. Whnewall lires.10 inch. 

RED or 
GREEN 
ENAMEL 
FINISH 

METAL TREE STAND 
16" Leg Span. 31/4" 
Ring Opening. 1/2 N. 
Water Capacity.. Pt  57 

3/99c 

6 Ft. Artificial 

SCOTCH 
PINE TREE g 

RICH MOSS GREEN 04: 
Flameproof. 74 	41 
Tips. Tripod Stand. g 

CB McHaul 

TRUCK 
with Battery, Mk. & Ampifier 

Age 3 and Over 

$ 1 288 

SATIN 

CHRISTMAS 

ORNAMENTS 
1% to 33/4 -inch 

SAYELLE 

KNITTING YARN 

Reg. $1.17 Now 

97° $388 
EtitZ 6I Atift1/4k214 3 EVA faiMW(OMFORWAttMeg4 
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-113  Irone's Ideas 
 
	a 

4-H'ers plan 
Yule program Socially 

Yours 

Pumpkin roll is treat .  

By IRENE KEATING 

Association of W's 
hears seminar report 

to combat TV sex and vio-
lence. 

A nominating committee 
was appointed to report at the 
Jan. 10 meeting when the 
group will choose 1978 of-
ficers. 

Fold into pumpkin mix. 
Spread in greased and floured 
jelly roll pan. Top with 1 cup 
chopped nuts. Bake at 375°• 
for 15 minutes. Turn onto.' 
towel, sprinkle with powdered 
sugar. Starting at narrow end; 
roll cake and let cool. Unrolr 
and spread with filling. 

FILLING: 1 cup powdered su-, 
gar, two 3 ounce packages 
cream cheese, 4 tablespoons„  
butter, 1/2  teaspoon vanilla. 
Beat until smooth, spread

,  

over cool cake, roll cake and
, 

 
wrap in foil. 

A lesson in parliamentary 
procedure was given for Beth-
el 4-H Club at its meeting last 
week in the Bethel Commun-
ity Building. Members also 
planned a Christmas program 
for the community. 

Irene Keating, County Ex-
tension Agent, instructed the 
group on parliamentary rules. 
Becky Hand presided for busi-
ness. 

Two visitors and three 
leaders were present with 19 
members. 

Sundowners Club 
schedules party 

TO BE MARRIED—Silvia Gonzales and Raul Belli Gana, both 
of Alamo, will exchange marriage vows at 5 p.m. Dec. 23 in St. 
Joseph Catholic Church there. The bride-elect, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Arturo Gonzales, formerly of Hart, is a graduate of 
Hart High School, attended Pan-American University and is 
employed as a secretary for Crest Fruit Co. in Alamo. Garza, 
associated with a McAllen firm of architects, received an 
associate degree in architectural drafting and design tech-
nology from Texas State Tech at Harlingen. His parents reside 
in Alamo. 

A BAD cold wouldn't be so 
annoying if it weren't for the' 
advice of our friends. 

—Kin Hubbard 

Time is rushing on and it'll 
soon be Christmas. I hope 
you're about ready. At least 
by having some cold weather, 
it helps us get in the mood for 
Christmas. 

If you're still doing some 
baking, you might enjoy this 
Pumpkin Cake Roll recipe 
from Leisa Smith. 

PUMPKIN CAKE ROLL 
Beat 3 eggs for 5 minutes, 

gradually fold in 1 cup sugar. 
Stir in 2/3  cup pumpkin and 1 
teaspoon lemon juice, add 1/2  
teaspoon nutmeg and 1/2  tea-
spoon salt. Stir together 1/4  
cup flour, 1 teaspoon baking 
powder, 2 teaspoons cinna-
mon and 1 teaspoon ginger. 

circwuramonacoantucti 
[Compiled from the Commu-
nity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth Am- 
erican Legion Auxiliary.] • 

DEC. 16 — Carl and Jo 
Parks, Mike and Melissa 
Goolsby, Tom and Raelene 
Hoelting. 

DEC. 18 — Mr. and Mrs. 
Coy Ringwald. 

DEC. 20 — Don and Glad-
iola Shipley, Glenn and Bar-
bara Lust. 

DEC. 21 — Bob and Pat 
Anthony, Butch and Jaci Hol-
comb, Edmund and Joyce 
Hunter, Kenneth and Alice 
Slough. 

DEC. 22 — R. C. and Cora 
West, Murry and Shirley 
Hall, Don and Mae Hargrove. 

THE pessimist sees only 
the tunnel; the optimist sees 
the light at the end of the tun-
nel; the realist sees the tunnel 
and the light—and the next 
tunnel. 

Piano pupils 

will appear 
in recital 

Ruff Duplicate Club 
has Christmas lunch 

Members will exchange 
gifts and entertainment in the 
holiday theme is planned, ac-
cording to Pat Evan, presi-
dent. 

A Christmas party for the 
Sundowners Home Demon-
stration Club will begin at 
7:30 p.m. Tuesday in the as-
sembly room of the court-
house. 

• Lawn & Tree Pests 
	 • Termites 

• Rodent & Bird Control 
	• Household Pests 

NOW YOU HAVE A CHOICE 
TRY 

HIGH PLAINS PEST CONTROL 
Ph. 647-5529 
	 * 	 Dimmitt, Texas 

Olan K. Moore, M. Ag. 	 Don Moore 
Experienced Entomologist 

THERE is only one way to 
treat a cold, and that is with 
contempt. 	—William Osier 

The Association of the W's 
at its meeting last week heard 
Patricia Vogler of Hereford 
report on the Planned Parent 
Seminar she attended at Am-
arillo Dec. 2 and 3. 

The seminar was held pri-
marily for educators and 
counselors, "for indoctrina-
tion of the planned parent-
hood program to be instituted 
into the public school system 
and liberal churches," Mrs. 
Vogler said. 

She said that program 
"started out with commend-
able goals and a service need-
ed by many Americans, but as 
years passed some of its 
highest positions have been 
taken by persons of humanis-
tic values and procedures." 

Seminar topics, she said, 
were teenage sexuality, sex-
uality of the mentally retarded 
and legal aspects of abortions 
and contraceptives. 

Another report was on a 
recent meeting of the Texas 
commission on the status of 
women, sent by Mrs. Don 
Workman of Lubbock, a com-
mission member who recently 
spoke here. She said the 500 
letters from women of this 
area which she took to the 
meeting influenced the com-
mission decisions. 

Mrs. Workman said the 
commission will work for 
strong rape laws, a program 
to inform women of present 
laws which aid them, and one 

We're having an old-fashioned Christmas 
Come share with us! 

North-south winners were 
Louise Nelson and Brenda 
Andrews, Selita Gholson and 
Weldon Skinner, tied for first 
and second places; Polly Man-
ning and Ruth Wright, thifd. 

Bobbie Damron arid Bessie 
Elder placed first for east-
west, Darlene Dowell and 
Genelle Craig were second, 
Jean DuLaney and Jestiiie 
Johnson third. 

Traditional holiday foods 
prepared by the members of 
Ruff Duplicate Club were 
served at the covered dish 
luncheon where several 
guests were entertained last 
Wednesday in the city hall 
assembly room. 

A gift from the members 
was presented to Ramona 
Annen, director and teacher 
for the group, as a combined 
Christmas-birthday gift. 

Special guests were Mr. 
and Mrs. Garnett Holland, 
Jim Hrabal and Fred Annen. 

Eight tables of players took 
part in Mitchell movement 
games at the Christmas party. 

Piano pupils who received 
blue ribbons at a recent piano 
festival at Wayland College 
will be among the students of 
Mrs. Leon Sanders who will 
appear in recital at 7:30 p.m. 
Monday in First Baptist 
Church fellowship hall. 

The blue-ribbon pupils are 
Kathy Acker, Leanne Crozier, 
Tammy Stanford, Stephanie 
Ryan, Becki Gregory, Dondi 
Hays, Stacy Wilson, Shannon 
Powers, Stephanie Killings-
worth and Beau Bennett. 

Each played before a judge 
selected by the Plainview Mu-
sic Teachers Association, 
which sponsored the festival 
at the college. 

The public is invited to the 
recital, which will present 
members of La Melodia Music 
Club composed of Mrs. San-
ders' pupils. 

Coffee has 
Christmas 
atmosphere 

how to be a 
smart shopper 
with the 
yellow pages 

"Happy Holidays" was the 
theme of decoration in the 
June Brown home at Hart for 
a Christmas coffee last Wed-
nesday morning. 

Calling hours were from 10 
to 2, and guests registered 
from Dimmitt, Plainview, 
Hereford, Springlake, Lock-
ney, Tulia and Santa Rosa, 
N.M. as well as Hart. 

Ecru linen covered the tab-
le, with red felt runners cen-
tered by an arrangement of 
holly, peppermint candles and 
figurines of two small boys. 
Party breads, coffee and spic-
ed wassail were served from 
brass appointments. 

Alternating at hostess du-
ties were Marlene Bennett, 
Sue Bennett, Maurice Carson, 
Bobbie Hill, Margaret Mor-
rison, Clarice Reed, Mamie 
Rich, Bonnie Futrell and Mrs. 
Brown. 

The Yellow Pages of your Continental Directory 
are an indispensable buyers guide offering you 
valuable information on name brands, services, 
dealer names, locations and business hours. 
Call for the lowest prices...locate the store that 
has the product you need...order by phone. 

Karl Rundberg, one of our Yellow Pages 
Sales Representatives, wants you to shop and 
save the easy way... and when you call - say 
"I found you in the Yellow Pages." 

AUCTION 

cCr Continental Telephone i 
Keeping You in Touch 
for a Better Tomorrow 
An Equal Opportunity Employer 

APPROXIMATE 
$260,000.00 

FURNITURE 
INVENTORY! 

Fixtures & Trucks! 

GOOD HOUSEKEEPING 
SHOP 

714 E. 10TH 
AMARILLO, TEXAS 

SATURDAY 
DECEMBER 17 

10:00 a.m. 

Name Brenda Include: 
Kroehler Swift., • 
Maddox . Sumer . Hecker 
Ithereid,  - Stritolounem 
Perrnalua . Stratford - 
Chluenden & Eastman 
Easunan Bedding - 
Apse.. 56 Rednxico 
values to 11.600 00 • 
Approx. 46 Dining Room Stan. 

ea to L1.000.00 - 
A 	140 ReelltuTI 
irrt Wall Huggers & Rockets • 
Appeal. 300 Soles & Earnests. 
Yalu.. to el .0:13 00 • 
Approz. 228 Occasional Chain. 
Values to IS00.00 • 
novena:60 Sofa Bade all 
by Kreehler, talues In $1.200.00 - 
ALL OF THE ABOVE INCLUDE ALL 
COLORS & STYLES? 
Caloric & C. E. Ranges - 
Eastman Company M*U1111120* 
& Rot Spntnp. 	elute' 
Quaser Cola,  Television, • 
Roll Top Desks . Etageres - 
Curio Shelve. • Gun ewe* 
Bookshelves. single to tnple 
wall units - Wash Stsueda • 
Caine Cabinets • Secretary 
Cloths • Vanguard Oil Paintings -
Premed Mirrors . Framed Prins • 
SPECIALS To Be Sold at 2:00 p.m .  

Antique Record Players - Antique 
Tablet • 2 Refrigerators - Range . 
1900 Edison Cylindrical Retard 
Player & lb Records • 
Carden Club Christ-rum Tree: 
VEHICLES to Be Sold at 310 p.m. 
1970 ChernelM C60 Truck w/ 
IS Frouhavf Van, Hydro Lilt Gate 
1970 Chevrolet C40 Truck w/16 
Freubaut Van. Hydro Lift Otte - 
1966 Ford FOOD. 	American 
Van. Hydro Loh Gate 
1969 Mark Ill, Black w/BleM 
Leader Interim - 
Mk. Equipment & Furnishing. 
to be sold at 2:60 p.m. • 
Shop Equipment - Dolly.. Toole - 
Au Commence • Much. Much Moro! 
!NSPCC-F. Friday. Dec 14, 
10 00 to SOO p.m - 'NOS-71,027S 
Fes Braehuns Contact - 

4101 WEST 34TH 
AMARILLO. TEXAS 8061352-1503 

Happg 

anniversary! 

Texas Office of Traffic Safety 

AUCTIONEERS 

-- 	

Open Till 7 P.M. 
Thursday Till 9 P.M. 

Free Gift Wrapping 
with each purchase of 

4.95 or more 

The Place To Go! 

SPORT 
COATS 

by 
Curlee & 

Warren Sewell 

3995  to 
160°° 

For That Someone Special 

LEATHER 
JACKETS 

115" to 143" Always a Nice Gift 

ARROW SHIRTS 

CURLEE SUITS 
OR 

WARREN SEWELL 
Two, three and 
Four Piece Suits 

Solids - Stripes - Prints 

900  to 19°° 9998  to 185°° 

PICTURES 

895  to 

1 395 

OTHER 
PICTURES 

to 4395  

TIES 
Wembley & Lilly Dache 

5°° to 85° 
OTHER TIES 3°° up 



e, .0 ,40 

Miaow Gift 9deao 
0"" ) 

• 

✓ Raiaa 

& 	Raja Stews 

Tape Raps awl Reroute/Ea 

v Wade Talkie Radio 

1, Sines Tapes awl Rastas 

✓ 9etueeig awl Timex Wattle* 

✓ Spakiestat Sett Bodies 

✓ Roakfigkia aKd 13alftetif.s 

t,  Smoke MOM 

v Sweatt AppCiascea melt aa Nato 
Poi Babies, Slew Cashew fig 
Dumyat Pleats 13anget Gude& 

— Llae Out adagios 
rag Away Peas — 

,0 
Package Sine 

Ka3aSt, Texas 	945-2270 

i) 

Value Priced $289" 
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15— LEGAL NOTICES Rotarians and wives 

will be entertained 
at the Friday meeting by six 
guests including visiting Ro-
tarian Roy Loveless and his 
wife of Fort Worth, Mike Zu-
niga, Anne Helderweirt and 
prospective member Bobby 
Byers. 

Homes tour 
is Christmas 
party plan 

MRS. LARRY CLARK 
. .. The former Christy Barlow 

MERRY CHRISTMAS!—Students of the Dimmitt Satellite 
School show their delight over gifts they received during a 
Christmas dinner in their honor Friday night, sponsored by the 
Castro-Deaf Smith Legal Secretaries Association. The legal 
secretaries treated the students to a fried chicken dinner at the 
Colonial Inn, then the youngsters and their hostesses 
exchanged gifts. Teacher Norma Conard also accepted a gift of 
575 for the school, which she said will help pay for a new 
vacuum cleaner. 

NOTICIA LEGITIMO 
La Agencia del Protection 

de Ambiente nos han avisado 
que nuestra sistemo tiene que 
satisfacer las regulaciones de 
la nivel de contaminacion de 
maximo microbiologica del la 
agua que se toma. La sistema 
tiene que satisfacer las regu-
laciones del departamento del 
sanidad de Tejas. 

Pruebas del agua analizado 
por el laboratorio del estado 
ensena que nuestra agua de la 
sistema ha fallado los limites 
asentados por las regulacion-
es del Estado y Federal pars 
la bacteria coliforma. La limte 
es una coliforma por cada den 
ml que han calculado de 
rutina las pruebas cada mes 
que han colegido. El organis-
ma coliforma es una indicac-
cion de contaminacion y no es 
danoso. 

La situacion donde la prue-
ba he reflejado una diferencia 
fue examinado tres dias con-
secutivos con acuerdo de las 
regulaciones. Las tres "Prue-
bes estaban en conformidad." 
La investigacion de la ciudad 
he revelado la diferencia el 
resulto de la pruebas tomadas 
y no de la agua que hemos 
tornado que se ha contami-
nado. 

Les vamos adviser de las 
aciones que conducimos para 
Segura que la ague de nuestra 
sistema, satisfecha cada nor-
ma estableceda. 

Members of the Dimmitt 
Rotary Club are reminded of 
the club assembly set for 7:30 
tonight (Thursday) in the 
meeting room of Rhoads 
Memorial Library. 

"Committee 	chairmen 
should have their committee 
reports ready to present at the 
meeting," Club President Bill 
Daimevik announced. 

After the meeting, mem-
bers will join their wives 
around 8 p.m. at the Datme-
vik home for a reception. 

At the Friday meeting a 
film on national defense was 
shown. Mrs. L. C. McLain of 
Hart, who had been sched-
uled to speak, sent the film in 
her stead. 

The film quoted several 
national military and civilian 
leaders who said that our na-
tion's defense position in 
comparison with Russia's is 
"precarious to say the least." 

Russian exile and author 
Alexander Solzhenitsyn was 
featured giving a speech 
against US detente with Rus-
sia, quoting Russian leaders 
as saying that detente will in 
no way affect the 'class strug-
gle.' 

The program Friday will 
feature the DHS Singers led 
by Doug Henry. 

Sixteen members and the 
club sweetheart were joined 

A tour of three new homes 
in Dimmitt will be conducted 
for the Young Homemakers' 
Christmas party to begin at 
6:30 p.m. today (Thursday), 
at 1605 Sunset Drive. 

The Jack Edwards, Bob 
Caddell and Arlie Petty 
homes, all on Sunset Circle, 
will be open to the members. 
Doris Petty, hostess at the 
third home, will welcome 
members and guests for a 
gift exchange, informal vis-
iting and refreshments. 

Secret pals in the club will 
exchange gifts, and members 
who are unable to be present 
are asked to send their gift 
packages to the Petty home. 
No baby sitters will be pro-
vided at this meeting. 

BIPARTISAN issue: A 	THERE'S no sense in ad- 
problem neither party knows vertising your troubles: no 
what to do about. 	 one will buy them. 

is 	LEGAL_ NOTICES,: 
_ 

LEGAL NOTICE 
We have been advised by 

the Environmental Protection 
Agency that our system 
failed 	to 	meet 	the 
microbiological 	maximum 
contaminate level of the 
drinking water regulations as 
well as those of the Texas 
Department of Health. 

Water samples analyzed by 
the State Laboratory showed 
that the water from our sys-
tem had failed the limits set 
by Federal and State Regu-
lations for coliform bacteria. 
The limit is one coliform per 
100 ml as the average of all 
routine monthly samples col-
lected. The coliform organism 
is an indicator of contam-
ination and is not harmful in 
itself. 

The location where the wa-
ter sample reflected a discrep-
ancy was rechecked three 
consecutive days in accor-
dance with regulations. All 
three "CHECK SAMPLES" 
were in compliance. The 
City's investigation revealed 
the discrepancy was the result 
of taking the sample rather 
than our drinking water being 
contaminated. 

We will keep you advised of 
the steps we are taking to 
insure that water from our 
system meets every establish-
ed standard 

-s- GARNETT HOLLAND 
City Manager 

City of Dimmitt, Texas 

15-10-3tc 
-s- GARNETT HOLLAND 

City Manager 
City of Dimmitt, Texas 

15-10-3tc 
acatcarbsvicattsanfrattaw 

Barlow-Clark vows 
spoken at Earth 

BIG shots are little shots 
who keep shooting. 

_toe  STANDARD OF QUALITY, PE
RFORMANCE AND STYLING... AGAIN! 

  

presenting 
ALL NEW 1978 

.asOLVIPS 

HOME ENTERTAINMENT VALUES 

Christy Barlow, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Barlow, 
and Larry Clark, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Troy Byers, repeat-
ed wedding vows at the First 
Baptist Church of Earth in a 
twilight ceremony Saturday. 

Both families reside in 
Earth and the Barlows are 
formerly of Dimmitt. 

Rev. David Burum was the 
officiant for the double ring 
ceremony, conducted in a 
setting of spiral candelabra 
and bouquets of orchid-tinted 
flowers tied with green ribbon 
bows. 

Miss Barlow was attended 
by Liz Pyle as maid of honor 
and Kelly Jo Wheatley as 
bridesmaid. Steve Randolph 
acted as best man and Jeff 
Washington of Springlake was 
the groomsman. 

Ushers were Claude Bar-
low, Steve Byers and Billy 
Pyle. 

Preceding the bridal party's 
entrance, Ruth Schaefer play-
ed organ selections and ac-
companied Sharron Hamilton 
who sang "Twelfth of Never" 
and "Evergreen." 

Her father gave the bride in 
marriage. She was wearing a 
gown fashioned by her mo-
ther, of white chiffon over 
bridal satin. The empire bo-
dice was trimmed in lace 
studded with tiny orchid ros-
ettes and green leaves. Full 
sleeves were gathered to wide 
cuffs at the wrists. 

The skirt widened at the 
hemline to form a circular 
train, banded with the lace 
and rosettes. The lower tier of 
her double veil fell over the 
train and the upper tier was 
elbow length. 

She carried a cluster of 
white carnations on a bridal 
Bible borrowed from a friend. 
For "something old" she 
wore her grandmother's pearl 
teardrop necklace and her 
costume included other luck 
pieces. 

Dresses of her attendants 
were carpet length, with 

teatimes ffte ear 
Ws  

WITH CHROMACOLORE 

sheer long sleeves. The maid 
of honor wore orchid and the 
bridesmaid lime green. Each 
carried a long-stemmed white 
carnation tied with ribbon to 
match her gown. 

The wedding reception was 
held in the church fellowship 
hall where the table was laid 
with lace over orchid and cen-
tered with an arrangement of 
lighted candles and white 
carnations edged in green and 
orchid. Ornamenting the 
triple-tiered cake were orchid 
rosettes and green leaves. 

The couple left for a week's 
honeymoon in Ruidoso. Mrs. 
Clark's travel costume was in 
western style. They will make 
their home in the Pleasant 
Valley community. 

The bride attended Dimmitt 
schools through her freshman 
year and graduated from 
Springlake-Earth High. She is 
a beautician employed at the 
Beauty Box in Earth. 

Clark is a graduate of L. B. 
Bell High School at Hurst, 
after attending Springlake-
Earth High. He is engaged in 
farming. 

19
„  

DIAGONAL 

001171 

NEW! 25 
DIAGONAL 

GIANT SCREEN 
CONSOLE TV 

FAMILY SIZE 
VIEWING! 

COMPACT PRICE! 

$47995  Student helps 
with WTSU 
holiday scene 

The PRENTISS•J1930W—Slimline styled decora-
tor model features Color Sentry, the Automatic 
Picture Control System. Solid-state chassis. Pow-
er Sentry System. Solid-state Tuning system. 
Brilliant Chromacolor Picture Tube. Attractive 
simulated walnut finish. 

The MONDRIAN•J2518W—Handsome modern 
styled lowboy console features Color Sentry, the 
Automatic Picture Control System. 100% solid-
state chassis for reliability. Power Sentry Voltage 
Regulating System. EVG-Electronic Video Guard 
Tuning System, Brilliant Chromacolor picture tube 
for that great Zenith picture. Rich, stylish simulated 
walnut finish cabinet. 

2k/k70® VALUE PACKED STEREO 

ilarN CHROMMOIDKII 
OUTSTANDING COLOR PERFORMANCE 

... IN A TRIM, COMPACT SIZE 

13" 
DIAGONAL 

$36995 The MINI-WEDGEJR587W—Striking design sim-
ulated walnut finish cabinet with distinctive slant 
shape. Solid-state AM/FM/Stereo-FM Tuner-Am-
plifier. Three speed record changer. Allegro 1000 
speaker system. Great stereo sound at a great 
price! 

The STEEN...11310 
—Trim, compact 
color portable for 
easy room-to- 
room portability. 

Handsome charcoal color finish. Solid-state chas-
sis and tuning system. Brilliant Chromacolor in-
line picture tube. Power Sentry Voltage Regulating 
System, 

$309" 
rte  CONSOLECONSOLE 

A Dimmitt student at West 
Texas State University, San-
dra Duke, is helping with a 
live nativity scene which will 
be presented Thursday and 
Friday on the hill at Kim-
brough Memorial Stadium. 

The Christmas scene is be-
ing offered as "a gift to the 
Panhandle community" by 
the Church of Jesus Christ of 
Latter-Day Saints Student As-
sociation at WTSU. Miss 
Duke, daughter of the Robert 
Dukes of Dimmitt, is a mem-
ber of the association. 

Costumes and a sound sys-
tem will be furnished by the 
WTSU drama department. 
Live animals will be a part of 
the scene which will be pre-
sented by students from the 
LDSSA. 

Members decided to give 
"A spiritual gift to the com-
munity, to help us remember 
what Christmas is all about.-
They hope to make it an an-
nual event. 

The performance is being 
staged at 15-minute intervals 
from 6:30 to 8 p.m. each day 
from Monday through Friday. 
It will be accompanied by a 
tape recording of sound ef-
fects produced at the Latter 
Day Saints headquarters in 
Salt Lake City. 

GREAT SOUND! STEREO 
DISTINCTIVE FURNITURE STYLING! MOW Performance 

Engineered! 
COMPACT BLACK & WHITE 

PORTABLE TV 12n 
DIAGONAL 

The SORROCCO.J900P—Elegant Mediterranean-
style cabinet in a rich simulated pecan finish. 
Solid-state Amplifier, AM/FM/Stereo-FM Tuner, 
Stereo Precision Record Changer, plus an 8-
track tape player. Terrific stereo sound at a tre-
mendous price you can't afford to miss! 

The YEOMAN•J121—
Sleek, sporty portable 
in three decorator col-
ors, 100% solid-state 
chassis for outstanding 
reliability, superb oper-
ating economy. Quick-
on Sunshines picture 
tube. Solid-state tuning 
system. All the quality 
you'd expect from 
Zenith at a pocket-
pleasing price. 

See our complete selection of new1978 Zeniths today! 

Kittrell Electronics 
Ph. 647.2197 	103 E. Bedford Dimmitt, Texas 

44,5itte-.40 tat:. 	&At:: 

GRIEGO 
DRAGLINE 
SERVICE 

Dozen, loaders 
for taihvater 

pit cleaning. 

Call 364-2322 or 
Moble No. 364-4741 



Yeti 
PitASINT ati1110 
LattaKarelider  

Ckiternmel frau come_ 

gratscans 

11(./  

... Dirndl Calainkar .4 GioNwPor 

p _ 

If you want 

SANTA CLAUS 
to risit your home 

or party for a 

nominal fee, call 

647-4508 
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IS—LEGAL NOTICES 15—LEGAL Nonce ' Bobbies win 
consolation 
at Tulia 

SIGNS OF THE SEASON—Chamber of Com-
merce Secretary Dorothy Magness shows the 
posters that were placed on the doors of 
Dimmitt restaurants before opening day of 
the pheasant season Saturday to welcome 

visiting hunters and remind them of the rules 
and courtesies of hunting. Sue Broderson's 
Dimmitt High School art students made the 
posters for the Chamber of Commerce.  

A 57-38 victory over Friona 
gave the Dimmitt High School 
Bobbies consolation honors in 
the Tulia tournament Satur-
day. The Dimmitt girls had 
previously defeated Farwell 
after losing to Lockney in the 
first round. 

Norma Sandoval was the 
top point-maker for the Bob-
bies in the 56-49 loss to 
Lockney, also in the Friday 
game when DHS swamped 
Farwell 72-33. She hit for 23 
points Thursday and 26 Fri-
day, when Lori Dyer added 22 
and Vicki Cleveland 20. 

In the consolation game, 
Cleveland led with 19 of the 
Bobbies' points, Sandoval had 
16 and Dyer 14. Hart girls champs Bovina man's 

funeral held 
Book runs 14th of S-E tournament 
in field of 40 

RUBY MOULTRIE SINGS FOR KIWANIS 
. 	Accompanied by Deanne Clark 

Gayle Book, who represent-
ed Nazareth High School in 
the state cross-country meet 
at Georgetown last weekend 
after placing fourth in re-
gional competition, ran 14th 
in field of 40 from all parts of 
Texas. 

Hart's varsity girls won the 
championship of the Spring-
lake-Earth tournament last 
weekend, defeating a strong 
Hale Center team by two 
points in the finals after 
squeaking past the S-E girls 
71-70 in overtime. Kiwanis makes $600 

on hunters breakfast 
Boozer and Brad Brock were 
among the four guests joining 
the 18 Kiwanians and club 
sweetheart at the meeting. 

Funeral services for Chess 
D. Woltman, 81, of Bovina, 
stepfather of Ilene Burnam of 
Dimmitt, were conducted 
Monday afternoon in the Bo-
vina First Baptist Church. 
Burial was in the Bovina 
cemetery. 

Born in Floyd County, Mr. 
Woltman was a Civil Service 
employee and had lived in 
Bovina 13 years. He was a US 
Army veteran. 

Survivors include his wife; 
six daughters, five sons, three 
stepchildren, two sisters, two 
brothers and 41 grandchild-
ren. 

Only in the opener, when 
Hart eliminated Lazbuddie 57-
37, did the Longhornettes 
have a chance to feel easy be-
fore a closing play. 

Hart placed two on the all-
tourney team, forward Mel-
anie Upshaw and guard Con-
nie Beavers. 

three games," Coach Kim 
Ratliff commented. "Marg 
Etheridge, Sherry Booe, Abby 
Mancias and Beavers all did a 
super job." 

The Hart Longhorns took 
fourth place for boys in the 
tourney, dropping their last 
game to Hale Center 69-44. 
Eliazar Castillo topped scor-
ing for Hart with 12 points. 

In their first game, Hart 
downed Lazbuddie 62-48 with 
Luther Isaguirre leading the 
'Horns with 22 points. Happy 
took the second game from 
Hart, 65-41. Vick Hart hit for 
16. 

INDIAN proverb—never 
test the depth of the water 
with both feet. 

CONTRACTORS' NOTICE 
OF TEXAS HIGHWAY 

CONSTRUCTION 
Sealed proposals for mowing 
and litter removal on State 
Department of Highway and 
Public Transportation Right of 
Way 

Maintenance Section 003 
Unit 3 

8 Ft. Strip Mowing 200 Acres 
Full Width Mowing 	1,443 A. 
Litter Pickup 	1,443 A. 
Castro County, will be received 
at the District Office of the 
State Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation, 
P.O. Box 771, Lubbock, Texas 
79408, until 9:00 a.m., January 
4, 1978, and then publicly 
opened and read. 
The State Department of High-
ways and Public Transporta-
tion, in accordance with the 
provisions of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 
Stat. 252) and the Regulations 
of the U.S. Department of 
Transportation (15 C.F.R., Part 
8), issued pursuant to such Act, 
hereby notifies all bidders that 
it will affirmatively insure that 
the contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertisement will 
be awarded to the lowest res-
ponsible bidder without dis-
crimination on the ground of 
race, color, or national origin, 
and further that it will affir-
matively insure that in any con-
tract entered into pursuant to 
this advertisement, minority 
business enterprises will be 
afforded full opportunity to 
submit bids in response to this 
invitation and will not be dis-
criminated against on the 
grounds of race, color, or na-
tional origin in consideration 
for an award. Plans and spec-
ifications are available at the 
Maintenance Office for the 
above mentioned county and at 
the office of William M. Pope, 
Supervising Maintenance En-
gineer, 601 Slaton Road, Lub-
bock, Texas. 
Usual rights reserved.15-11-2tc 

CONTRACTORS' NOTICE 
OF TEXAS HIGHWAY 

CONSTRUCTION 
Sealed proposals for mowing 
and litter removal on State 
Department of Highway and 
Public Transportation Right of 
Way 

Maintenance Section 003 
Unit 4 

8 Ft. Strip Mowing 288 Acres 
Full Width Mowing 	1.737 A. 
Litter Pickup 	1,737 A. 
Castro County, will be received 
at the District Office of the 
State Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation, 
P.O. Box 771, Lubbock, Texas 
79408, until 9:00 a.m., January 
4, 1978, and then publicly 
opened and read. 
The State Department of High-
ways and Public Transporta-
tion, in accordance with the 
provisions of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 
Stat. 252) and the Regulations 
of the U.S. Department of 
Transportation (15 C.F.R., Part 
8). issued pursuant to such Act, 
hereby notifies all bidders that 
it will affirmatively insure that 
the contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertisement will 
be awarded to the lowest res-
ponsible bidder without dis-
crimination on the ground of 
race, color, or national origin, 
and further that it will affir-
matively insure that in any 
contract entered into pursuant 
to this advertisement, minority 
business enterprises will be 
afforded full opportunity to 
submit bids in response to this 
invitation and will not be dis-
criminated against on the 
grounds of race, color, or na-
tional origin in consideration 
for an award. Plans and speci-
fications are available at the 
Maintenance Office for the 
above mentioned county and at 
the office of William M. Pope, 
Supervising Maintenance En-
gineer, 601 Slaton Road, Lub-
bock, Texas. 
Usual rights reserved.15-11-2tc 

This was the first year for 
Nazareth High to enter cross-
country competition, and 
Coach George Cox said after 
the state meet, "We are very 
pleased with the showing of 
the girls in their first year and 
their enthusiasm which prom-
ises more for next year. Our 
aim is to take the team to 
state next fall." 

NHS, in Class B, competes 
in cross-country with teams 
from A, AA and AAA schools. 

• On the go 
Sen. Kent Hance and son 

Ron of Lubbock were here 
Saturday pheasant hunting 
and visited his mother Beral 
Hance. 

AUCTIONEERS — LIQUIDATORS — APPRAISERS 
SALES MANAGEMENT — REAL ESTATE 

M&A AUCTIONEERS, INC. 

Meade Michael 
	

Dean Sanders 
	

Darroll Adams 
353-5898 
	

938-2217 
	

499-3558 
Amarillo 
	

Hart 
	

Umbarger 

In the championship game, 
which ended with a 62-60 
score, Upshaw led the Long-
hornette push with 24 points. 
Stacy Averitt and Norma Ca-
tano hit for 19 each. 

Against Springlake-Earth 
the offensive was led by Av-
eritt with 38; Upshaw got 31 
in that contest. Averitt was 
again the top shooter in the 
Lazbuddie game, with 23 
points to Upshaw's 20. 

"Defense for the Longhor-
nettes was outstanding in all 

The Dimmitt Kiwanis Club 
fed around 225 at its annual 
Pheasant Hunters' Breakfast 
Saturday and took in over 
S600 before expenses, it was 
reported at the Monday meet-
ing. 

Club President Mark Cleav-
inger reminded members to 
bring a S1 gift to be exchang-
ed at the next meeting. 

Program chairman Gene 
King introduced Richardson. 
Elementary music teacher 
Ruby Moultrie, a graduate of 
West Texas State University 
who is in her first year of 
teaching. She sang "0 Holy 
Night" and "Sweet Little Je-
sus Boy," accompanied by 
Deanne Clark. 

Bill Thornton was awarded 
the hand-shake dollar. 

Key Club sponsor Fred Al-
len and members Robert 

PLAINS MEMORIAL 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Pre-

sas of Dimmitt are the parents 
of a girl, Tina Kay. Born Dec. 
10, she weighed 6 pounds, 
61/2  ounces. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Rod-
riquez of Hereford are the 
parents of a boy. Natan was 
born Dec. 11 and weighed 3 
pounds, 111/2  ounces. 

18 HOUR COMFORT 
"Your hometown people 

offering you these services.... 

*IRA 
(Individual Retirement Account 
...up to '1,500. per year tax deductible) 

*KEOGH 
(up to '7,500" per year tax deductible 
retirement for qualified individuals) 

*DIRECT DEPOSIT SAVE UM $3" 
(Your social security checks can be 
mailed directly to us) 

(Off SUGGESTED RETAIL PRICES) 

4 	le  We call it our comfort sale because all 18 Hour" Bras, Girdle 
and All-In-Ones are made with Spanettet the exclusive stretc I I  
fabric that gives you ail-over comfort and control for hours. Ask about any of those services at....... 

C 	54100 
Mitlf 	on 18 HourR Bras including s.  

the New 18 Hour` Tricot Bra' 

C:SAVE$2"on 18 Hour' Girdles 	Cr.  ti-Plain Sam 
and Loan Association SAVESSmon 18 Hour` All-In-One 

Sale ends lanuary 7, 1978 
Open Thursday & Saturday Til 9:00 p.m. 

FSLIC 
i

master Lnarge 

HEREFORD & DIMMITT 

647-2189 
SW 3rd & Bedford • 

Dimmitt, Texas Cit.  
• 

11->-; 

him Issoll Ns Cis 

44.7 Instal • MO 110 
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SANTA, I want a new 
Viking for Christmas, You 
can get me values up to 
$150.00 in Extras. 
You know the new Viking 
never needs oiling, has 
jam-proof 	hook, 	self- 
adjusting tension and a low 
gear for really tough and 
tedious sewing jobs and 25 
year guarantee. 
Please, Santa!!! 

THESE ARE AT 

NELLIE JANES 

121 E. Bedford 
647-5212 
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overload electrical circuits, 
and disconnect tree lights 
before leaving the house or 
retiring for the night. 

USE toll-free reservation 
numbers of major hotel or 
motel chains to get overnight 
accommodations during holi-
day travel, if saving time and 
gasoline are important. 

BEFORE decorating the 
holiday tree, check all elec-
trical decorations for frayed, 
cracked or worn insulation 
and inspect the plug for pos- 
sible damage. Be sure not to 647-3123 For Printing 

•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 
• 

'At least we got TFB's 
attention,' Sadler says 

Although the Texas Farm 
Bureau, in its recent annual 
convention, defeated the Cas-
tro County FB's resolution 
calling for support of the 
American Agriculture move-
ment, CCFB President Gale 
Sadler believes the attention 
it attracted is of value in 
farmers' fight for better pric-
es. 

Sadler said he is "concern-
ed that it be understood that 
no board member or officer of 
the TFB spoke against the 
resolution and that it received 
support by speakers from the 
floor during the discussion." 

It also drew coverage from 
Houston television and radio 

vis scoot 

08.00tt 
Imo 

010 coovou 
BANQUET SPEAKER for the annual Dimmitt Young Farmers-
Young Homemakers awards was Bill Serpalius of Hereford, 
manager of Texas Speaker of the House Bill Clayton's traveling 
office. Serpalius, an alumnus of Boys Ranch and a past state 
FFA President, spoke to the group about making their dreams 
come true through hard work, personal improvement and self-
discipline. 

15—LEGALNOTICES. Swiftettes score win 

stations which were interested tivity of the International Wo-
only in that one issue at the men's Year organization." 
convention, Sadler said. 	That resolution also called for 

"The matter was decided informing state officials that 
by a majority vote of the dele- IWY resolutions do not rep-
gates, and I think their main resent the opinions and wish-
basis for decision was that es of "all women" as the or-
they wanted no connection ganization claimed. 
with organized labor or 	—Amending a current TFB 
strikes, and didn't want the policy favoring regulation of 
Farm Bureau to be on record natural gas for agricultural 
in support of any organization purposes by the Texas Utility 
over which it has no control," Commission. After recent 
Sadler said. 	 problems of North Plains 

He pointed out that the res- farmers when the Emerald 
olution did not ask for support Gas Co. threatened to ter-
of a farm strike, and only minate delivery of gas for irri-
sought backing of the move- gation, the amendment would 
ment on an individual basis. 	exempt gas companies which 

Sadler said he was given are not classified as utilities 
time to speak for the resolu- (not serving a town or city). 
Lion, received a courteous 
hearing without interruptions, 
and was satisfied with the 
way the vote was conducted. 

Amendments were offered 
and voted on and questions 
were raised and answered, he 
said, but parliamentary rul-
ings did not interfere with a 
full hearing and a fair vote, 
the CCFB president said. 

The Castro County delega-
tion was complimented by the 
TFB president, other officers 
and members for their pre-
sentation of the controversial 
issue. 

• • 

NOTICE 
The City of Dimmitt offers over Vega by 57-37 for sale the following: 
(1) One 1973 Ford 4-door 

Sedan, Serial No. 30535258- 
545, complete with V-8 En-
gine. 

(2) One 1973 Ford 4-door 
Sedan, Serial No. 3G53S258- 
546, complete with V-S En-
gine. 

All offers shall be made by 
sealed bid, delivered to City 
Clerk of the City of Dimmitt at 
City Hall, Dimmitt, Texas, on 
or before 6:30 P.M. January 
3, 1978. Vehicles may be in-
spected at City Hall during 
office hours. Automobiles 
above described are in fair 
condition. 

-s- GARNETT HOLLAND 
City Clerk 

City of Dimmitt 
Dimmitt, Texas 

15-11-1tp 

'Carom/41r Turrilmbhi—Assures consistent, even 
cooking every time — eliminates hot and cold spots. 

*Variable Cooking Control—Allows you to select the 
speed of microwave cooking appropriate for the 
food being cooked: FULL POWER, ROAST. SIM-
MER, DEFROST. 

'60 minute digital timer—Precise, accurate timing 
up to 59 minutes, 59 seconds. Easy to set and read 

"5-sided recipe g uldrt. —Coordinated with Variable 
Cooking Control. Shows which foods cook best on 
each setting. Over 50 commonly cooked foods on 
5-sided chart 

CARJUSEL 

-k\• 

Our 7-year limited warranty. 
The must expensive part of any microwave oven is the magnetron 
tube. So most manufacturers give you a 5-year warranty. 

But we offer the only 7-year limited warranty in the business. 
Not to mention a 2-year limited warranty on all other parts and 
labor with in-home service. 

For complete warranty information and terms, look in your Sharp 
microwave cookbook. --x 

The Nazareth Swiftettes led to added 13 and Lori Gerber 
Vega varsity girls all through 11. 
a game at Vega Friday night, 	"Schulte and Gerber did a 	 SHARP 
building their margin from a fine job as playmakers all 
bare 7-6 at the end of the first through the game," Cox said. 

	

quarter to a final 57-37 vic- "They kept getting the ball to 	MODEL R-6750 
tory. 	 Cheryl so she could make the 

Only in the third quarter shots that scored." 
was Vega able to score more 	In a 69-41 win over Spring- 
than 8 points, as the Swiftette lake-Earth Tuesday night of 
defense held firm. Coach last week, the same Swiftette 
George Cox said everybody on forwards scored in two fig-
the Nazareth squad played on ures. Hartman got 37 points, 
both ends of the court during Gerber and Schulte 11 each. 
the evening. 	 Nazareth's JV girls also 	• 

"Both teams were cold at defeated their Vega counter-
shooting in the first quarter parts Friday, 30-20, in a five-
but we warmed up fast in the player game. Sharon Gerber 
second and the halftime score made 15 of the NHS tallies 
was 28-13," Cox said. "Vega and Marlene Huseman 12 
did better in the third quarter more. 
and it ended 42-29, but we 
held them again at the fin- 	CREATE a hand-made ac- 

STAY warm this winter by ish." 	 cessory for an extra-special 
dressing in thin layers of wool 	Cheryl Hartman with 29 Christmas gift to family or 	 Home Owned 82 Operated By Jim & Elen Hralied -- 

	

clothing which provide insula- points topped the Nazareth friends, but be sure colors 	647-5690 	 317 N. Broadwa>i 
tion against cold weather. 	offensive effort, Karen Schul- and styles fit their decor. 	 ••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

Resolutions on several oth-
er matters were adopted at 
the convention, Sadler report-
ed. They included: 

—Recommendation of "an 
increase in the selective state 
sales tax to help finance 
public education, with a cor-
responding reduction in the 
ad valorem tax." 

—Reaffirmation of the pol-
icy of pushing for taxation of 
agricultural land on its pro-
ductivity rather than its mar-
ket value. 

—Opposing "any future 
use of state and national tax 
dollars to fund any state ac- 

DIMMITT APPLIANCE CENTER 

karVitaCIVgatat ULVAVWLVQC aitatiSg*CMCSNOWSICSatglaaCatalggrateUtttSatat 

GIFT SLIPPERS 
FROM SANTA 

Boys & Girls 

299  to 5°° 
Ladies 

399  to 799 	 

Mens 

3" to 10" 

ALWAYS FREE 
GIFT WRAPPING! 

IN DREIHTT 

cHRISW ns sae BLAZER 

3299  

BLOUSE 

2399  
Gift Her With A 

COAT 
• Raglon Sleeves 

• Melton 

• Double Stitch 

SHIRT 

1899  

Gift Her With 
Hanes Sheer Stretch 

PANTY HOSE  
Gift Her With 

PANTIES 
• Briefs • Bikini  

Super Look Smoothing 

-1 95 
s_ pr. 

i 29  tO 9p? 

Visa & 

Mastercharge 

Cards 

Welcome 

74 99  PANTIES 
By Playtex 

Gift Her With 

395  (0 75,)? 

PAJAMAS 5 99  (0 1099  
Or A Short 

COAT 
• Plaid Fur On 

Hood & Cuff 
• Belted 

• Long • Baby Doll center 
stage II 

DIVISION OF SUE ANN. INC 

44 99  Fashion tailoring — solid blaz- 
er and front-pleat skirt ac- 
cented by o delicate print 
shirt. British tan and navy 
Skirt and blazer, 100% 
Visa' polyester, the fabric 
that gives you superior 
comfort, stain release and 
the bright-
ness you 
deserve 

LADIES FASHION 
BOOTS 

USA 
a 1 999  to 2799  

• Waltz Length 
Long•  

GOWNS 5 99  to 1299  
GOWN & ROBE SET 24 99  to 2999  

Sale! PLAYTEX BRAS 

267  to 734  
GIRDLES & PANTY GIRDLES 

497  to 8" 
VISA' is o registered trademark of Milliken & Compar  

Gift Him With 

KNIT SHIRTS 
By Campus 

Mena Perma Press 

WE 	SHIRTS 
as low 

3 99  to 9'99  as 

Mens Flannel 

SHIRTS 
999  to 1399  
Mens Perma Press 

c-- 
SLACKS 

12°° to 275° 
as low as Risistol & 

Bailey Felt 

HATS 

MENS DRESS BELTS 

6"w 15" 

Mens Velour 

ROBES 

15 99  to 1999  
Other ROBES 

799 

Mens Tony Lama 

Genuine Lizard 

Mens Ski Type 

Cardigans Pull Over 

SWEATERS 

Undecided? 

Give Him 
1 	Or Her 

a Gift 
Certificate 

Gift Him With A TIE 
Or Two For Christmas 

Solids • Stripes • Patterns 1 1 99  tO 1 999  
COWBOY BOOTS 90% 

Reg. '129" 	/150 Ad 
Now Only 7 7 pr. 	OFF 

HARIVIAN'S IN DIMMITT WHERE THE CHRISTMAS ACTION IS! 25° to 550  
attatiflawag=StattaiflAttatiatVateitSagaVQ.1 :areaterwatreaCatrearalfrent•V*%. 



THE Autocrat of Russia 
possesses more power than 
any other man in the earth; 
but he cannot stop a sneeze. 

—Mark TwaN. 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 

300 West Bedford 

Ph. 647-4464, Dimmitt, TX. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 

Meeting In City Hall 
Community Room 

Donald Price, Pastor 
Phone 647-3403 

Sunday-- 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.r4 
Morning Worship.. 11:00 a.m; 
Children's Church.... 5:30 p.m; 
Evangelist Service.... 6:00 p.m 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE; 
5th and Halsell 

Rev. Henry G. Perrin, Pastor 
Phone 647-2651 

*:• 

9:45 a.mr, 
Morning Worship.. 11:00 a.m;' 
NYPS 	 6'00 p.m.: 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m.; 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 

Sunday & Monday 

JOE DON BAKER 

144 
 - SUSAN SARANDON 

Chedlered 
Rag 
ar 

Pa 
—...... WISH 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH;::; 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 
Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9 . 45 ten 
Morning Worship and 

Lord's Supper 	 10:45 a.m 
Evening Worship 	600 p.m • 
Wednesday— 
Bible Study. 	7:30 pin... 

. 
• • 
• • 

HEARING AID SERVICE 

7th & Ash, Plainview, Texas 
296-7710 

Afraid You're 
Going DEAF? 
If you are hard of hearing— 

if you hear but have trouble 
understanding words— 
plan to 

ATTEND THIS ?Tee 

BETTER-HEARING 
WORKSHOP NOW! 

Wednesday, Dec. 21st 
10:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. 
Senior Citizens Center 

3rd & Lee - Dimmitt, Texas 

• FREE CONSULTATION 
get the facts about hearing loss and what 
you can do about it 

• FREE ELECTRONIC HEARING TEST 
find out if you really have a hearing 
problem 

• FREE DEMONSTRATION 
see how tiny the latest Beltone aids really 

are 

• FREE GIFTS 
to celebrate the event 

• FREE SERVICE 
on most makes of nearing aids 

• FREE WIND NOISE REDUCER 
for some types of aids 

1/2  PRICE SPECIALS, 
Fresh Beltone Brand Batteries — 1/2  price 
(limit—one package per customer) 

Can't Come In? Call 647-2654 
We'll Come to You' 

_Relent° 
WWI 	• 111 SSC, 
at fa, it, 
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Pheasant hunters from ever where are auests here 
By MYRTLE SHEFFY family get together at his 

sister Beulah Newton's house. 
Others there were Yvonrig 
and Wayne Davis from Pecos 
and the Garner Balls from 
Hart. 

The bird hunters came in 
last weekend. I didn't get 
many names but the company 
at Susan and Brock Merritts 
and Brian's house were Su-
san's parents Jean and Gerald 
Sitterle and friends Frank and 
Rosemary Sullivan, all from 
Houston. 

Jack and Mary Lou Miller 
of Amarillo are at the north-
west farm and had many 
guests in for the hunt. Johnny 
Johnson from Sherman, a 
lawyer Adkinson from Dallas, 
and 10 others from the Dallas 
area, all Jack's friends. And 
Mary Lou says eight men 
came Sunday from Amarillo. 
Ed Fancher was one. She has 
been busy with a big auction 
in Amarillo. The money goes 
to the Heart Center. 

have been at Cordell, Okla. 
for several days visiting her 
sister and husband Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Shield. 

• 
Mrs. Opal Harvick and 

Jeannette Harvick of Tahoka 
visited in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Brock Saturday. 
They also visited Jeannette's 
father in South Hills Manor. 

Mrs. Ross Summers was 
the 80 year old birthday girl 
Sunday, so her sons and 
wives. Melvin and Juanita at 
their house had the party 
dinner, with son Bill and 
Marthella and grands, Gerald 
and Patti and children and 
Charles and Sue and baby 
helping. Mrs. Summers' bro-
ther Roger Blodgett came 
from Wichita, Kan. and many 
friends from this area came 
bringing gifts and good wish-
es. 

Cecil and Blanche Ginn 
went to Earth Sunday for the 

wards. 
• 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Ellison 
came over from Lawton, Okla. 
to visit their aunt Mrs. N. E. 
Gass, who is in Plains Mem-
orial Hospital. Mrs. Gus is a 
long time resident of Here-
ford. Now lives at South Hills 
Manor. Mr. Kern of the home 
is recuperating from a recent 
heart attack. 

Another Baptist group 
meeting for the week of pray-
er for foreign missions was in 
the pretty new home of Arlie 
and Doris Petty, also on Sun-
set Circle. Delores Golden 
presided and Carol Cluck 
gave a book review on Roy 
Rogers' book, "My Favorite 
Christmas." All the groups 
had lunch at the Colonial Inn 
Restaurant another day with 
Mrs. Gladys Kaltwasser of 
Farwell as the guest speaker. 

Jimmy and Gwen Buckley 
are home from a visiting trip 
to Paris, Tenn. where they 
visited Jimmy's four sisters. 
They probably took a few side 
trips. 

Darlene says do come to 
her house for the annual 
Christmas open house Satur-
day, 9:30 to 11:30. Other 
hostesses are Mona Merritt, 
Geneva Schaeffer, Mary 
Cluck. Go 2 1/2  miles south on 
highway 385. 

• 
Carolyn Copeland was host-

ess at the Christmas bridge 
party at the Country Club Fri-
day. She baked a good cake 
and made dips and then 
Harry Hauf made a big pot of 
chili to serve everyone who 
came in, but Carolyn's friends 
were Bobbie Damron, Dor- 

• 

Shannon DeVaney came 
home from Tech at Lubbock 
bringing guests to hunt. 
Bruce Arendale's home is 
Houston, Dr. Allen Hull and 
son Scott from Dallas and Ron 
Prati, also from Dallas. 

Carl and Gail Bruegel serv-
ed beans and chili to probably 
a hundred men here, from all 
over the place out at the old 
west farm. I know Bo Bryant 
and Vance and Dale Reed 
came from Amarillo. 

The Loves came down from  

Phone 6474239 
For Starting Tine 

Friday & Saturday 

welcome and feeding us. The 
girls are Bobbie Ruth Hill, 
Sue Bennett, Mamie Rich, 
Clarice Reed, Margaret Mor-
rison, Bonnie Futrell and 
Marlene Bennett. 

And Wednesday evening at 
Jim and Ina Cleavinger's 
house most of the townspeo-
ple came for the open house. 
And hot cider, coffee, candies 
the girls made and little cakes 
were served by the beautiful 
daughters. All were dressed 
up in long skirts. You know 
the song, "A Pretty Girl is 
Like a Melody." How true. 
Katy Wright and Mildred 
Bradford helped hut. 

And this Wednesday the 
Methodist ladies were special 
guests at a dinner at Ina's 
with the young ladies of the 
church as hostesses. All of us 
went by to see Trudy Dennis 
and Jo Warren's Christmas 
arrangements. 

Mrs. Jack Edwards was 
hostess to one of the Baptist 
Mission ladies groups Thurs-
day morning. This is their big 
Lottie Moon Mission Fund. 
Irene Carpenter brought the 
meditation and several pray-
ers were offered for the work-
ers in foreign fields and Dr. 
John Street. I was a guest and 
enjoyed the fellowship with 
our friends and in Jan Ed-
wards pretty home. New peo-
ple I met are Gladisla Shipley 
and Joyce Davis, a pretty 
blonde girl, the wife of county 
attorney Mr. Davis. Others 
there were Mary Edna Hen-
drix, Ruby Maples, Mauzie 
Youts, Dorothy Hopson, Wi-
nona Bunch, Sara Hill, Delo-
res Golden was refreshment 
hostess, and little Holly Ed- 

• 
• 
• 

FARM FRESH 
PECANS 

5% miles west of 
Hart on FM 145 

Amarillo, guests of their 
daughter Jane and David 
Behrends and girls. 

Norman Bradley and son of 
Lubbock and Howard Bethel 
and two sons and friends 
came from Odessa to hunt 
pheasants. They were guests 
of Ronnie and June Parker. 
Mr. Bradley is manager of 
Mr. Parker's insurance busi-
ness. 

Mrs. Pauline Godfrey left 
here this week for Mitchell, 
Ky. to visit her daughter 
Carolyn Grunhof and family. 
She will stay through the 
holiday season. 

Glen and Ruth Mary Map-
les and daughter Elaine of 
Amarillo were having Sunday 
dinner at the Colonial with 
Ethel Hunter and (mom) Lena 
Maples. The Glen Maples are 
former Hart residents. 

• 

Ted Sheffy and Earnest 
Mayhew went to Oklahoma 
City last weekend to see the 
big cowboy rodeo. Some Hart 
people went, too. 

Ferne Dickey is home from 
a five-week stay in Houston 
where she was with her sister 
who has been quit ill. She did 
visit the Streets, Bro. John 
and Dorothy. 

The town is happy that 
John Street is much improved 
from his recent heart surgery 
in Houston. His wife Dorothy 
is with him and his friends 
Robert Ryan and Jimmie 
Howell were with the family 
for the surgery and Wednes-
day Dan Heard and Bay 
Baldridge went to Houston to 
lend support. You know John 
is pastor of First Baptist 
Church. 

Clint Cox has been in the 
hospital for several days with 
a lung problem. Hope he is 
okay by now. • 

Tommie Sue Petty went to 
Houston last week to be with 
her daughter Jeannine and 
Robert White who are expect-
ing a new baby. "He or she" 
may be here by now. 

Last week was party week. 
And don't you love all the get 
togethers? 

To Hart Wednesday for the 
Christmas open house at June 
and Dwayne Browns place. 
Santa and reindeer on the 
roof, many lights, such pretty 
arrangements inside and 
those pretty hostesses in love-
ly long dresses making us feel 

Robert Hawkins 

time friend and neighbor, 
died Sunday night. He was 
not well .for a long time. Our 
sympathy goes to Ceal Carlile 
and the Jack Patton family. 

The Castro County Museum 
will be open each Sunday af-
ternoon from 2 to 5 p.m. Mrs. 
P. P. Robb is there weekday 
afternoons. Go by and see. 
The people have done much 
in a year's time. Mrs. Vick 
will take your membership 
money which helps keep it 
dean and open. 

• 
Roger Lively and friend 

John Jackson were here from 
Wagoner, Okla., near Gran-
ite, to visit with aunt and 
uncle George and Ruby Bag-
well, and the men were hunt-
ing pheasants. 

Susie and Jack Bradford 
had her brothers and friends 
here for the hunt. They are 
Steve and Mark Hartt from 
Dallas and Marshal and friend 
Bill Rogers from Fort Worth. 

James and Mildred Brad-
ford flew east to Hermitage, 
Tenn. to attend the wedding 
of Mildred's nephew Mark 
Settle and Sabrina McCord. 
Mark is the son of Earlene 
(Lust) and Newt Settle. 

Clyde and Betty Renfro 
went to Amarillo the first of 
the week to visit their son 0. 
C. Renfro and for a dinner 
with Bob and Sally Munday. 
Clyde is doing well from his 
recent surgery. 

Don Robb and sons Richard 
and Burl of Idalou were here 
to visit parents P. P. and 
Madge and his brother Ted 
and family. They tried to find 
the pretty birds. 

Jesse and Ruby Wooten 

othy Elder, Bessie Elder, Ret-
ta and Billie Cluck. Opal 
Bearden. Cletha George and 
Myrtle. Okay, Bobbie and 
Myrtle were high score win-
ners. 

Betty Huckabay was host-
ess to the Thursday bridge 
and she served dessert and 
coffee to Reba Touchstone, 
CS Carlile, Ruth Jackson, 
Aural Davis, Anita Moths, 
Dorothy Elder and Jeanie 
Miller. 

Nathan Nelson was eleven 
years old Dec. 7. His mom 
Mrs. Don Nelson took him 
and his friends to Hereford 
after school then back to Na-
than's house for hot dogs and 
birthday cake. Going were 
Michael Love, Steven Bagley, 
Doug Nelson, Gregory Sava, 
Billy Patton, Bobby Nino and 
Kyle Boozer, Kim Howell and 
Stephanie Ryan. Nathan 
thinks this will be his last 
party but I doubt it. 

• 

Ellen Kuntz Wilson is here 
from West Virginia for her 
annual visit with her brother 
Fred and Helen Kuntz and 
the family. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. F. Mc-
Cormick celebrated their 60th 
wedding anniversary with a 
reception at the Baptist Fel-
lowship Hall Sunday after-
noon with Oma Dee and Dan 
Heard hosting the affair. She 
will tell you about it though. I 
saw Kay and Martin Young 
and girls Dale and Becky 
down from Sunray, and Kay's 
sister Linda and Bill Taylor 
from Dallas. A pretty party 
with hundreds of friends and 
relatives calling. 

Horace Carlile, our long- 

IGLESIA DE CHRISTO 
E. Lee and S.E. Third 

Evangelista — Miguel Zuniga 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6'00 p.m.  
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all. 	7:30 p.m. 

an  
hut Troth:: WI" 	•— 

CKUCX NORMS 
ar • 	
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•1  LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ronnie Travis, Pastor 
Phone 647-2300 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m 
Morning Worship 	11:00 
Training Union 	6'00  pin:: 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services 	 8:00 PRIMERA IGLESIA 

BAUTISTA MEXICANA 
300 N.E. 7th 

Pastor Van E. Hughes 
Secretarla Sara Salinas 

Tesorero Gabriel Montle' 
Domingo: 
Estudios Biblicos.... 10:00 a.m. 
El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m. 
Miercoles: 
Instruction Biblica.... 8:00 p.m. 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

CARLILE 
7heatee 

Dimmitt, Texas 

a 	- 
sr 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Marvin Roark, Pastor 
Bill Anderson, Music & Educ. 

110 S.W. Third 
Phone 647-4106 or 647-4107 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	10:45 a.m. 
MYF, Jr. Hi & Sr. Hi 	 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	610 p.m. re,  
Wednesday— 
General Meeting 
WSCS 	 910 a.m. 
Choir 	  7:30 p.m.  

LITTLE FRIEND 
aa  

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Western Circle Drive 

Rev. Ed Manning, Minister 
Sunday— 
Church School 	10:00 axis,: 
Common Worship... WOO a.m.: 

• • 
• 
• 

• 
• 
• 

• 

a 
• 
• 

Any mother can tell about a child's 

love for her doll, and the world of 

PRETEND that they live in. They 

confide in the doll, reprimand 

them, and care for them. 
The Church is God's appointed agency in this world 
for spreading the knowledge of His love for man and 
of His demand for man to respond to that love by 
loving 	his 	neighbor. 	Without 	this 	grounding 	in 	the 
love of God, no government or society or way of life 
will long persevere and the freedoms which we hold 
so dear will 	inevitably perish. Therefore, 	even from 
a selfish point of view, one should support the Church 
for the sake of the welfare of himself and his family. 
Beyond that, 	however, every person 	should uphold 
and participate in the Church because it tells the truth 
about man's life, death and destiny; the truth which 
alone will set him free to live as a child of God 

. 

Sunday School 	 
Sermon 	  
Lord's Supper and 

Feet Washing 	 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday Services.  

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
glrL PRIMOJENITO 
‘1East Halsell St. 

Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 
10:00 a.m.: 
11:00 a.m.: 

11:30 a.m.: 
710 p.m; 

. 7:30 p.rtt 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 
Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship _11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6'00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Choir Rehearsal 	8:10 p.m. 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
Gary Cook, Pastor 

302 S.E. 2nd 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m.  
Morning WorshIp 	11:00 a.m. 
Christ Ambassadors and 
Children's Church 	 6:00 p.m. 

Evangelistic Service. 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
[Northside] 

Third and Helsel, Streets 
Leonard Tittle, Minister 

Phone 6.47-528.4 
Sunday— 
Bible Study.. 	... 9.30 a.m. 
Morning Worship.. 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	 600 p m.  
Wednesday— 
Ladies Class 	 2:00 p.m.  
Mid-Week Service. 	 8:00 p m. 

The church is a real and true 

friend. The church may be counted 

on in times of need, in times of 

trouble, and in times of sorrow. 

The church also wants to share in 

your times of joy. 

"A friend loveth at all times." 

•  

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 
Dale Wells, Minister 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship . 10. 30 a.m. 
Evening Worship. 	. 6. 00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 	 7 - 30 p m 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship. 	.11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	T30  p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services . 7:30 p.m. 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 	". 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 
1001 W. Halsell — Ph. 647-4219 
Sunday— 
Mass in English. 	7:00 a.m. 
Mass In Spanish. 	10:30 a.m. 
Religion Classes 	9:30 a.m• 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday— 
Mass .  	7:00 a.m. 
Holy Days— 
Mass in English 	7'00 a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	800 p.m. 
Confessions— 
Friday 	700 to 8:00 p.m 
Baptism by Appointment 

'4 
• 
• 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Raymond Jones, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship.. 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6-00 p.m. 
Evening Worship. 	7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	7:30 p.m. 

MISSION PENTECOSTES 
404 N.E. 6th St. 

Sunday School 	10:00 a.m.  
Sunday Evangelistic.. 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service.. 8:00 p.m. 
Friday Bible Study.... 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH 
412 North East Street 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	600 pion 
Evening Worship 	 

47:°°30 Monday W.M.0 	 
Tuesday Brotherhood 	 7:55 p.m. : 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	7:30 p.(p. 
Sanctuary Choir 	Friday 

A • 
and Business Institutions 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 

DIMMITT TV CABLE .45i 
DENNIS FLORAL & GIFTS'  

Across From the Hospital 	dir 
647-3191 

Individuals Published Through the Cooperation of the Local Ministerial Association and Sponsored by the Undersigned 

CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 	HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. 

DIMMITT '66' INC. 	 SEALE FLORIST 
Ph. 647-3554 

CBS EQUIPMENT CO. 

HAYS IMPLEMENT 

GOODPASTURE, INC. 
IDimmitt Plant] 

FIRST STATE BANK 



11EIEFOID: Dot Ceilhott-3414353 

DINMITT: tick Wirt-4174111 

311011A- S. D. es- 147-3311 

SPRINKLER 
SERVICE 

Division of BIG T PUMP CO. 

Only $9" 

ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

BUILDING 
MATERIALS 

CAPABLE— 
DEPENDABLE 

Phone 938-2183 
Had and Tula 
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Nazareth  HEW revises guidelines for hospitals 

Big crowd cheers all-stars 
By VIRGIE GERBER man of Channel 7 and Hubert 

Honor roll announced 
for Nazareth school 

Backus. 
• 

Cory Stork,. his wife Sue 
and their three children of 
Houston visited in the home 
of his grandmother Meta 
Stork Monday evening. 

Enjoying dinner at the Bert 
Venhaus home Dec. 8 was the 
family of Flora Backus, Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Backus, Mrs. 
Helen Backus, Mr. and Mrs. 
Loyd Bonds of Dumas and 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Venhaus. 

units may be too strict." 
Bentsen noted that the 

guidelines currently exempt 
rural hospitals if they provide 
services to patients who 
would otherwise be more than 
45 minutes travel time from a• 
hospital. 

"The secretary has assured 
me that revisions in the 
guidelines will clarify and 
broaden the exceptions apply-
ing to rural and community 
hospitals," the senator said. 

care and asking for changes. 
"I was pleased by the res-

ponse from Secretary Cali-
fano. He expressed deep con-
cern about the problems of 
health care in rural areas and 
he promised revisions in the 
guidelines," the senator said. 

"I have been concerned 
that the proposed guidelines 
might force small rural hos-
pitals or community hospitals 
to close and that the stand-
ards applying to obstetrical 

Senator Lloyd Bentsen was 
notified by HEW Secretary 
Joseph Califano that proposed 
health planning guidelines is-
sued in September, will be 
revised to insure that they 
don't lead to reduced medical 
care in rural areas of Texas. 

Bentsen had written to Cal-
ifano in October expressing 
concern about the effect the 
Health, Education and Wel-
fare Department guidelines 
would have on rural health 

- The Nazareth Senior Class 
sponsored a basketball game 
Saturday evening between the 
taro News All-Stars from Am-
arillo, a team made up of 
staffers from KVII-TV, and a 
team made up of Nazareth 
coaches and ex-students. A 
large crowd of basketball fans 
thoroughly enjoyed the eve-
ning. The lucky winners of the 
pie auction were Coach Cox, 
Coach Bagnall, Bill Tell 7fort- 

Happy Birthday 
to 

Durward 
"Butch" 

Strickland 
We still love you, 

even though you're 

50! 
Bessie, Beth, Jackie, Lonnie, Sue, 

Butch, Porn and Grandkids. 

They also celebrated their 
mother's 92nd birthday. 

Attending the funeral of 
Frank Ebbers Dec. 6 in Ster-
ling, Colo. were Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Backus, Mrs. Robert 
Verkamp and son Leon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Shirley 
of Hereford visited with her 
sister and husband the Leo-
nard Wilhelms. 

Mrs. Ruby Hubbard and 
daughters of Fort Worth, Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Spencer and 
daughters of Amarillo and 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Gipson 
and Denise McLain of Rui-
doso, N.M. were home for the 
marriage of their brother 
Claude Annen and Brenda 
Robertson. 

Mrs. Margaret Womack is 
at home recuperating after 
surgery in a Plainview hos-
pital. 

Ray Schulte is in North 
West Hospital in Amarillo a 
few days for tests. 

Fred Acker is home from 
the hospital and is progress-
ing as well as expected. 

Enjoying dinner in the Hel-
en Backus home Sunday were 
the Hubert Backus family, the 
Francis Backus family of 
Hereford, the Edmund Back-
us family of Dumas and the 
Arnold Huseman family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charley Hill 
and family of Dimmitt and 
Mrs. Ella Hill of McLean 
spent the weekend with Char-
ley's daughter, Lee Ann and 
family in Scott City, Kan. 

Cora Dirks, a cousin of 
Sylvia Hoelting, and her hus-
band Reuben Staudt of Me-
ridian spent the weekend with 
relatives and enjoyed some 
pheasant hunting. 

EIGHTH GRADE 
"A" — Karen 	Birkenfeld, 

Elizabeth Wilhelm, Michael 
Kern, Danelle Schmucker. 

"B" —Roxane Birkenfeld, 
Pierce Brockman, Denise 
Acker, Brenda Hoelting, Ka-
ren Huseman, Vera Ramaek-
ers, Patti Schacher, Joe Kle-
man, Paul Verkamp, Calvin 
Schulte. 

NINTH GRADE 
"A" — Perry 	Brockman, 

Laura Kleman, 
"B" — Rodney 	Kleman, 

Dale Hoelting, Gerry Kleman, 
Lori Gerber, Dwayne Acker, 
Joe Hochstein, Dorothy Wil-
helm, Christine Huseman, 
Randy Huseman, Greg Huse-
man. 

TENTH GRADE 
"A" —Dale Wilhelm, Te-

resa Brockman. 
"B"—Dianne Hochstein, 

Debbie Schacher, Nadine 
Durbin, Doretta Ramaekers, 
Robert Pohlmeier, Jimmy 
Kern, Jeff Schmucker, Ro-
anne Acker, Michele Acker. 

ELEVENTH GRADE 
"A" —Jimmy Huseman, 

Gayle Book, Patricia Kern. 
"B"—Darryl Birkenfeld, 

Bernard Acker, Paul Huse-
man, Kerry Kleman, Joyce 
Acker, Evey Wilhelm, Colleen 
Gerber, Glenda Gerber, Ger-
maine Pohlmeier, Paula Mau-
rer, Kenny Gerber. 

TWELFTH GRADE 
"A" —Tony Brockman, La-

donna Brockman, Kenny 
Brockman, Cheryl Hartman. 

"B" —Chris Book, Debbie 
Schilling, Karleen Kleman, 
Kim Altman, Anna Huseman, 
Gary Huseman, Frank Acker, 
Eddie Huseman, Keith Hoel-
ting, Derwin Huseman, Lon-
nie Ehly, Tina Spence. 

647-3123 For Printing OPEN 24 
HOURS 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

CO-OPpoithwifg! 
YES, COST OF PRODUCTION IS HIGH — 
HOWEVER, WE CAN ASSIST YOU 
IN REDUCING IT 

Recent tests prove CO-OP Hybrid Seed Corn to be outstanding 
varieties in this area. 

Dimmitt Agri Industries' Introductory Early Booking Program 
offers the producer reduced cost for seed by: 

* Early Booking Discount of 75 cents per bag 
* Assures supply and on the farm delivery 
* Quantity discount available 
• Prepayment discount available 
* Lower prices ie. $36.00 per bag for plateless planter seed 

Visit the Nazareth and Dimmitt Farm Stores and study and 
compare the local test plots results with your own results and 
farming practices. 

OFFER GOOD THROUGH DEC. 31, 1977 

DIMMITT AGRI INDUSTRIES 
CASTRO COUNTY'S CROP PRODUCTION CENTER 

THE CHOICE OF MORE FARMERS 
	it 
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HOLIDAY 
3PECIALSI 

CONVENIENCE STORES 
tie* ktiets 

Take Your Cotton 
to Your 

Co-Op Gin 

We appreciate 

your business. 

CASTRO 
CO-01) GIN 

Christmas Tree Stands $2" 

32 Oz. Coke & 7-UP $1" 6 Pack — 

Shurrme Coffee, 1 Lb. Can $22  

CHRISTMAS 
TREESI 

NICE SELECTION 
I LOW PRICES 

,Avaawneste; BLUE SPRUCE. 
41$044-fr SCOTCH PINE. 
imaiske AND FIR 

LIGHT BULBS, SNOW, ICICLES, 
WRAPPING PAPER, RIBBON, 

AND BOWS 

SELF BASTING 10-12 LB. M. 

ARMOUR'S TURKEY 

a 59' 

WHAT YOU PAY FOR THIS 
IS BASED ON THE PRICE OF 

A BUSHEL OF THIS —0* 

El OA D 

Here is the honor roll for 
Nazareth Schools for the sec-
ond six-week period. 

FIRST GRADE 
"A" —Shana 	Birkenfeld, 

Jennifer Brockman. 
"B" — Kyle 	Schilling, 

Stephanie Brockman, Brad 
Kleman, JoAnn Fernandez, 
Tammy Drerup, Calvin 
Lange, Wendal Huseman, Re-
gena Schacher, Dale Birken-
feld, Robert Wilhelm, Linda 
Birkenfeld, Howie Mosier, 
Trent Johnson, Lee Kiernan. 

SECOND GRADE 
"A" —Stacy 	Albracht, 

Charles Birkenfeld, Melissa 
Brockman, Kelly Hoelting, 
Michelle Schulte, Theresa 
Verkamp. 

"B"—Marlon Backus, Ed-
die Bermea, Paul Birkenfeld, 
Wesley Dobmeier, Gregg 
Gerber, Julie Hatla, Darrin 
Heiman, Bobbi Steffens, Brad 
Hoelting, Cory Hoelting, 
Rachel Huseman, Renee 
Huseman, Chris Schmucker, 
Heath Schulte, Barbie Stef-
fens, Wayne Wilhelm. 

THIRD GRADE 
"A" —Russell Acker, Alan 

Birkenfeld, Wade Drerup, 
Phillip Durbin, Mario Hart-
man, Clint Hoelting, Craig 
Huseman, Kenneth Wilhelm, 
Shawn Wilhelm. 

"B" —Delia Bermea, Sheila 
Acker, Paul Bermea, Pamela 
Ehly, Julie Fernandez, Mat-
thew Hatla, Charlotte Heck, 
Raney Hochstein, Kenneth 
Kern, Chris Kiernan, Criselda 
Mata, Leroy Schulte, Patrick 
Birkenfeld. 

GRADE FOUR 
"A" —Gail Birkenfeld, Ra-

mona Heiman, Darryl Hoel-
ting, Bruce Huseman, Frankie 
Huseman, Mike Huseman, 
Troy Huseman, Cecilia Kern, 
DeZane Schacher, Kelly Schil-
ling, Annette Schmucker 
Debbie Schmucker, Eugenia 
Shelton, Elaine Verkamp, 
Theresa Wilhelm. 

"B" —Dale Albracht, Rob-
ert Birkenfeld, Kevin Hoel-
ting, John Kleman, Brian Ra-
maekers, Benny Schacher, 
Kyle Schacher, Billy Steffens, 
Craig Wilhelm. 

FIFTH GRADE 
"A" — Nancy Hatla, Ricky 

Backus, Rex Acker, Lance 
Brockman. Hector Bermea, 
Kenneth Kleman, Paul Hart-
man. 

"B" —Dwight Acker, Virgil 
Birkenfeld, Leona Gerber, 
Dorothy Durbin, Patsy Bir-
kenfeld, Chris Gerber, Russell 
Hoelting, Mark Kleman, Kim 
Drerup, Chrisalda Bermea, 
Anita Huseman, La Dawn 
Schmucker, Howard Steffens, 
Billy Huseman. 

SIXTH GRADE 
"A" — Kevin Acker, Eliza-

beth Albracht, Anne Birken-
feld, Joel Birkenfeld, Cheryl 
Hoelting, John Schmucker, 
fiery Verkamp. 

"B"—Donald Birkenfeld, 
Philip Birkenfeld, Scottie 
Book, Stanley Drerup, Wade 
Durbin, Sidney Gerber, Curtis 
Hoelting, Bart Huseman, 
Douglas Huseman, Mark Kle-
man, Francis Kern, Mark 
Huseman, Renee Ramaekers, 
Shari Schilling, Dean Schach-
er, Marvin Schmucker, Roger 
Schulte, Eric Wilhelm. 

SEVENTH GRADE 
"A"—Mary Jean Huse-

man, Janet Huseman, Jeanie 
Wilhelm, Deanna Hoelting, 
Rhonda Hoelting, George 
Hochstein, Tammy Heck, 
Sharon Birkenfeld. 

"B" —Kent Huseman, Ed-
die Steffens, Damian Wil-
helm, Doyle Schulte, Allen 
Maurer, Annette Hoelting, 
Randy Hartman, Colette Ack-
er, Raef Albracht. 
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Lindsay's Zimmatic Zimmatic Crop Lease is a revolutionary leasing 
program. If you don't take a long, hard look at it, you'll be 
shortchanging yourself. The Zimmatic Crop Lease Is unique 
in the industry. When you study this offer you'll see that 
Lindsay is ready to go the distance with you and share some of 
the same risks you face every year. WILSON 

FRANKS  

Whether you raise corn, alfalfa, wheat, sugar beets, potatoes, 
soybeans or whatever, the Zimmatic Crop Lease can work for 
you. Although the lease payment is based on the changing 
price of corn, Lindsay designed the program considering that 
over the long-tent other crop prices generally fluctuate with 
corn. 

Consider the features of the Zimmatic Crop Lease. First of all, 
if corn prices plunge, so does your lease payment. But also 
consider the low security deposit 'lowest in the industry] and 
the fact that It's a 12-year lease [longest in the 
industrylmboth features Improve your cash flow each year of 
the lease. Your Zimmatic is out there raising your first year's 
crop before your first payment is due.And you'll be getting an 
annual interest payment on your security deposit to use as 
you wish. 

Come in and see us soon. When we put a pencil to this 
program, mill see that no other center pivot irrigation 
company has a finance program that can compete with the 
Zimmatic Crop Lease. 

ill 49 0 
DOI QUARTERS  

1010(1% 

BUTTER- en.  70c 	CHOCOLATE 
MILK CT1. ill 	 MILK 

NMI 
Celery Hearts, 1 Lb. Pkg. 49` 

CREAM  Term: 
Payment: 

Security Deposit: 
Rate: 

Option: 

12 years 
Arrears 
5% of equipment cost 
Depends on corn price 
Conversion to standard 
10-year lease 

OME FOR THE 
OLIDAYe$ 

PECIA 

BUY A 
49' COKE 
AND KEEP 
THE GLASS 

501 W. Bedford, Dimmitt 



FOR INSURANCE CALL 

Kent Birdwell, Agent 
116 E. Jones St. 
Phone 647-3427 

Lilo a good neighbor, 

State Farm ic there. 
State Farm Insurance Companies 

Home Offices: Bloomington, Illinois 

STATE FARM 

a 

INSURANCE 

Put a Gas grill 
under your 

Christmas tree. 
C9 save 

Now you can buy a Gas grill in the box, wrap it, put it under the 
Christmas tree . . and save money. This will not only make an impressive 
present (it's sure to be the biggest one under the tree) but right now will 
save you $401  While our present supply lasts. you can get a $30 discount 
on any Gas grill in stock . . . then, save another $10 when you pick it up in 
the box 'Installation not included.) 

It makes a great gift package, but a Gas grill will be most appreciated 
when you use it. A touch of a match will start you on the way to enjoying 
delicious, charcoal-flavored foods. 

Give a Gas grill to yourself . 	or someone else who deserves a great 
Christmas. Call Pioneer. 

4.  11°  
IONEER NATURAL GAS COMPANY 

(A Divisional PIONEER CDSPOR41.0N1  

wiarilltaanat 

LAN D BAN K 
imrenhen 

Bully Bull is eating Cluck Fertilizer's 
Bull Shipper, the economical liquid feed 
supplement that supplies protein, min-
erals and vitamins. Cattle that feed on 
Bull Shipper eat better and are in better 

health and condition and make a better 
appearance for cattle buyers. Your Cluck 
Fertilizer dealer does all of the work, call 
us today, we are no further away than 
the end of your phone. 

Call or come by: 
CLUCK FERTILIZER 
Hart Hwy. 194 
647-3121 
Dimmitt, Texas 

CLUCK FERTILIZ4ft 

DON'T BUG ME, 

GAL, WHILE I'M 

EATING MY 

BULL SHIPPER! 

BULL SHIPPER 
COMES FIRST! 1c2 

CLUCK FERTILIZER 	BULL SHIPPER 

LIQUID 
FEED 
SUPPLEMENT 
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71 traffic deaths 
seen on holidays 

Boys Ranch Christmas fund started 
Box 1890, Amarillo 79174, or 
may be taken to the office at 
600 W. 11th St. in Amarillo. 

Amarillo department stores 
cooperate with the Christmas 
Suit Fund by giving special 
discounts on Igiys' suits. Oth-
er boys will receive gift pack-
ages of clothing that will in-
clude shirts, ties, jackets, 
trousers or other articles 
needed by them. 

"A new suit or clothing 
package is the best Christmas 
gift any of our boys will re-
ceive," Patterson said. "It is 
a year-round reminder of 
those who really care." 

Donations to the Christmas 
Suit Fund may be mailed to 
the Boys Ranch Office, P.O. 

The annual drive to outfit 
all of the 370 boys of Cal Far-
ley's Boys Ranch with new 
suits began today. 

Purchasing new suits for 
the boys with donations of $35 
is a favorite way for many 
friends of the ranch to help at 
Christmas time. 

"His first suit is something 
a boy never forgets," Virgil 
Patterson, ranch president, 
said. "We want to make it a 
happy Christmas, not only for 
the boys now living at the 
ranch, but also for new boys 
who will be coming to us 
during the coming year." 

M. C. ADAMS, O.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 	364-2255 
Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Monday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:30 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 

Col. Wilson E. Speir, direc-
tor of the Texas Department 
of Public Safety, today es-
timated that traffic accidents 
in Texas during the combined 
Christmas and New Year 
weekends will claim 71 lives. 

He noted, however, that 
some of the deaths could be 
prevented if motorists would 
drive carefully and participate 
in the state's "Light the Way 
for a Safe Holiday" program. 

Speir said 41 deaths are 
likely to occur in the Christ- 

- -.atlas period from 6 p.m. Dec. 
23, through midnight Dec. 26. 

Another 30 traffic fatalities 
are estimated for the New 

"HERE'S WHAT I WANT"—Jose Garcia is 
practicing so he can tell the real Santa Claus 
the next time he sees him. The second grader 
is reading his letter to Santa as he looks at the 
door decoration of his classroom. Jose is the 

son of Mr. and Mrs. Jose Garcia of Dimmitt, 
and his teacher is Sydna Lynn. Jose's letter, 
along with all the others from elementary and 
pre-school children across the county, will be 
printed in the Christmas edition of the News. 

Year holiday which extends 
from 6 p.m. Friday, Dec. 30, 
through midnight Monday, 
Jan. 2.  

The "Light the Way for a 
Safe Holiday" program calls 
on all motorists in Texas to 
drive with their low-beam 
headlights turned on in the 
daytime, as well as night, 
during the Christmas and 
New Year weekends. 

"We feel this 'Light the 
Way' program, particularly 
with widespread participation 
on the part of drivers, will 
serve as a very meaningful 
reminder to others to drive 
safely," Speir said. 

The DPS director observed 
that traffic deaths in Texas 
are currently running about 
11 percent over 1976, with 
much of this increase caused 
by the fact that three out of 
four motorists are violating 
the 55 mile speed limit. 

"On the interstate high-
ways where nine out of ten 
vehicles exceed 55, traffic fa-
talities are up approximately 
47 percent from a year ago," 
the DPS director added. 

Uittu from the ibrarug Fulfer completes 
Army's program 

During the "Light the Way 
for a Safe Holiday" program, 
Speir urged motorists to hold 
their speed down and refrain 
from drinking if driving. He 
also urged drivers to keep 
their vehicles under control at 
all times and avoid following 
too closely. 

By BRICK AUTRY 
Librarian 

US Army Specialist Five 
Bert D. Fulfer, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. James R. Fulfer of Dim-
mitt, recently completed the 
Headstart program in Ger-
many. 

Headstart is an orientation 
program designed to acquaint 
new arrivals with the German 
culture. Training is given in 
fundamentals of the German 
language, German customs, 
geography and history. 

Spec. Fulfer, a technical 
controller in the 270th Signal 
Company in Germany, enter-
ed the Army in December 
1972. 

The specialist is a 1970 
graduate of Springlake-Earth 
High School. 

The American farmer builds two things 
better than anyone else in the world. 
He builds the next generation. passing 
along a special kind of wisdom... 
respect for the soil. honesty, independence. 
and faith in the future. And he builds his 
land. leaving it better than he found it. 
That kind of building usually requires 
borrowed long-term capital. That's where 
we have helped for 60 years. FIRST thing to do to pre-

pare the garden: Get your 
tools back from the guy next 
door .  

The Land Bank 
The /nut. c4-  oetterations 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
FEDERAL LAND BANK ASSN. 

OF DIMMITT 
105 W. Bedford 647.3235 
Irving F. Upshaw, Manager 

We have made an attempt to renew all present voter 
registration certificates for the next two years beginning 
March 1, 1978, and have mailed out a new yellow colored 
certificate to all persons who registered for 1976 and 1977. 

YOUR RETURN ADDRESS 
P.O BOX 157 
01904111. TEXAS 79027 

POSTMASTER - DO NOT FORWARD - RETURN POSTAGE GUARANTEED 	 STAMP 

VOTER CUT ALONG DOTTED LINE IPOTANTE - CORTE FOR LA LJNEA DE PUYTOS) 

At this writing there are 14 
days left for Christmas shop-
ping. What are you getting to 
give as gifts? Will you be 
giving books? If so, the fol-
lowing is a guide for you. 

1: Children's Books: 
Today there are more good 

children's books on the mar-
ket than ever before. Besides 
the old favorites, Dr. Suess 
and Curious George, there are 
new authors coming into 
prominence who are going to 
be excellent for years to 
come. The book illustrators 
today are of very high quality. 
Today's printers can repro-
duce colorful drawings much 
better than years ago. Yet, 
there are also more cheap 
worthless books on the mar-
ket, too, put out by careless 
publishers trying to reprint 
and sell old editions. One of 
these is Golden Books. The 
little Golden Books which you 
see on the news stands are 
colorful and plausibly cute 
enough to be right for child-
ren. However, the binding 
and paper are cheap and the 
stories are often hackneyed 
with no imagination. They are 
usually junk—that includes 
Golden Book Encyclopedia, 
which is a picture book with 
no distinction. 

When you are buying books 
for children, remember that, 
like all other books, the prices 
have gone up. Don't be 
tempted to buy cheaper books 
because you'll get poor bind-
ing, cheap paper and they 

won't stay together very long. 
Thumb through the book and 
observe the pictures, the 
reading level, and the con-
struction of the binding. The 
binding and book covers must 
be sturdy and the paper must 
be somewhat thick to stand up 
to normal wear. 

2: Adult books: 
Books are big business. 

Contrary to the belief that 
television has ruined the read-
ing habits of Americans, TV 
has actually stimulated more 
reading and the demand for 
books has increased. 

It is possible to get books 
on any subject, from ESP to 
child pornography. Publishers 
put out "coffee-table" books, 
books with high quality pho-
tos, beautiful color prints for 
$35.00 to $120.00. 

Like everything, inflation 
has made a visit to the book-
store a painful event some-
times. In case you haven't 
been to a bookstore lately, 
you'll. find, to your honor, 
that books have gone up 
about 75%. A hardback book 
averages about $10 now (only 
$6.95 three years ago). 

RECOMMENDATION LIST 
Adult books 

A Country Diary of an Ed-
wardian Lady by Edith Hol-
den 

New Mexico by photographer 
David Muench 

Children's Books 
Once upon a Garden Hose, el- 

ementary 	grade, 	by 
Charles Land 

Roll of Thunder - Hear my 
Cry, junior high, by Mil-
dred D. Taylor 

MARX WRITE 

CASTRO COUNTY 	 VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 
(CONDADO dr CASTRO) f CIRTIFKA DO de REGISTRO EtECTORA L) XENT BIRDWELL 

SECRETARY of STATE 
(SECRETARIO de ESTADO) 

Pledge Raley 
(Nimrod). &tutu° 

0000000 

YOUR TELEPHONE NO. 

806-617.5336 

cr. 

REGISTRAR of VOTERS 
(REGISTRADOR de VOTANTES) 

Mary Jane Doe 
123 Anywhere 'Street 

•si 

a 

Name and mailing  address (Nombre y dirraltin postal) 
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However, several hundred of these have been returned to 
us due to changes of address. We have attempted to find the 
correct address for these but most of them will be cancelled 
for lack of current address information. 

If you have not received a renewal certificate for the period 
beginning 3-1-78, please call or come by the County Tax 
Office so we can keep your registration in effect for the 
coming two years. 

If you have received a renewal certificate and some of the 
information on it is incorrect, please contact this office at 
your earliest convenience. Thank you, 

KENT BIRDWELL 
Tax Assessor-Collector, Castro County, Texas 
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RECORD 
SETTER 
SALE 
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Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet is out to set a new sales record for 1977. 

If you're in the market for a new car or truck, 

now's the time to make a deal! 

RECORD 

SETTER 
1977 Caprice 
Demonstrator 

CAPRICE CLASSIC 4-DOOR 
Stock #C15A 

This 1977 demonstrator is loaded with 
"power" items—seat, door locks, win-
dows, trunk opener, steering, brakes. It 
also has air conditioning, remote control 
mirrors, cruise control, V8 engine, auto-
matic transmission, ComforTilt steering 
wheel, digital clock, AM radio with tape 
player, and special custom cloth trim. 

Save $1500 

Save on an Impala 
1978 IMPALA 4-DOOR 	 Stock #C14A 
Save more than $1000 on this two-tone blue Impala. Deluxe seat belts, tinted 
glass, floor mats, air conditioning, remote mirror, cruise control, V8 engine, 
automatic transmission, ComforTilt steering wheel, steel-belted VVSW tires, clock, 
radio, rear speaker, value group, vinyl trim. 

Burns 
Regular 

Fuel! 

PICKUP 
CLEARANCE! 

We want to sell ALL the Pickups and trucks we have on hand by the end of December. 

The name of the game is "Move 'Em Out"—and you'll be the winner in savings! 

1978 CUSTOM HALF-TON PICKUP 	 Stock #T32A 
Here's a sensible pickup at a sensible price. Burns regular fuel, with two fuel 
tanks. Long wide bed. Heavy duty shocks, stabilizer bar, 350 V8 engine, auto- 
matic transmission, power steering, power brakes, radio, gauges. 

$5100 

Big Custom Pickup--Loaded! 
1978 CUSTOM HALF-TON PICKUP 	 Stock #P6A 
Long wide bed, burns regular fuel. Features include tinted glass, air conditioning, 
350 V8 engine, automatic transmission, radio, rear step bumper, full foam seat, 
gauges, power steering, power brakes, trailering special. Solid white, blue 
interior. 

$5555 

Buy where you get 
service after the sale! 

At Reeve-Fleming, we don't forget you 
after the sale. You'll get fast, dependable 
service by factory-trained technicians 
at Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet, 
"The Home of Mr. Goodwrench." 

MR. GOODWRENCH SPECIAL 
Oil change, filter and lithe: 

Taking care of your car yourself can sometimes be a dirty job. But 
it's our business. So right now, if your GM car is ready for a lube 
job, oil change and filter, why not let Mr. Goodwrench do the 
work? This special price includes a five-quart oil change, a new 
oil filter, proper chassis lubrication and a check of differential and 
transmission fluids. It's a good way to keep your car running 

11111 381 5;W  11 	 tileC1111111.1 16t1111647131111 

 
smooth. 

REEVE-FLEMING 
CHEVROLET 

"Home of Mr. Goodwrench" 

II I 	II 	IN 

GENERAL. MOTORS PARTS DIVISION 



A new concept 
in carefree living 
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	 RIn necked Pheasant 

JOIN THE 
CONTEST 

Sponsored By 

SO. NAZI 
FARM STORE 

BROWNING 
SEED CO. • 

A 22 BROWNING AUTO RIFLE 
Will Be Given Away On December 26, 1977 

All Feathers Must Be In By 12 Noon, December 26 

• 
4 

• 
• TO THE PERSON 

BRINGING IN THE LONGEST 
PHEASANT TAIL FEATHER! 

*4 
*4 • 
•

4 

044  

In event a juvenile wins, it must be claimed by the parents. 
041  

•
4 

South Nazareth Farm Store, hic. .4 

We Are Supporting The Agricultural Movement 
2 miss south of Nazareth on FM 168 	 t4S-222 *4 • 

• • • • • • • • ••• • • • • • • • •  • • • • • 
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"Hey Santy, I thought this `twas the 
season to be jolly!" 

/MASER OF FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 

COW POKES By Ace Reid 

Ace---arD - 
La- Las' 
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Overheard: "She's a regu-
lar clothes horse. The clothes 
she wears make her look like 
a horse." 

Here's Hart's school mem 
Here are the school lunch.  

menus for Hart schools for 
Dec. 19-23. 

Travelers spend 
$497,200 in county 

green beans, fruit cup, milk. 
THURSDAY — Sandwich-

es, toned salad, pork and 
bean salad, peaches, •milk. 

FRIDAY — No school, 
Christmas holidays begin .  penditure Model. 

It was the latter which 
timated that in 1975 Texas 
had dislodged New York for 
third place in the nation's 
travel industry. The 1976 fig-
ures, however, show Texas 
back in fourth place behind 
California, Florida and New 
York.  

MONDAY — Fried fish, 
tartar sauce, cornbread, 

es- blackeyed peas, coleslaw, 
cake, milk. 

TUESDAY — Corn dogs, 
ranch style beans, tossed sal-
ad, cake, milk. 

Kent B Irdwirfl 
116 E. Jones St 
Phone 647-3427 

WEDNESDAY — Turkey 	Dlmmltt T 
and dressing, giblet gravy, 
hot rolls, cranberry sauce, 

Elbert Seitz 

On 
Wall Street 

By Bob Hill 
Edwards & Sons, Inc. 

have to suffer. 
Meanwhile the purchase of 

overseas crude oil will con-
tinue at its present rate. The 
increase of oil from the North 
Slope of Alaska will be offset 
by purchases of crude for the 
strategic petroleum reserve 
now being created to give us a 
buffer against another oil em-
bargo. 

The US dollar, now selling 
at deep discounts against the 
Japanese yen and the German 
mark, will continue weak. But 
the dollar has soared against 
the Canadian currency, and 
Canada is our largest trading 
partner. 

Seitz is new 
on SCS staff 

Plaign &Wets 
I,  1-acre homesites along Highway 86 West 

I,  Acreage tracts for estates 

'Two large animals per estate allowed 

',Custom builders available 

What's cooking 
at the schools 

Elbert Seitz is a new mem-
ber of the staff in the Soil 
Conservation Service here, 
serving as conservation plan-
ner. He comes from a similar 
position at Perryton. 

Seitz fills the vacancy left 
when Monte Edwards was 
transferred from the local of-
fice to the state office at 
Temple, according to N. A. 
Bryson, manager here. 

After graduating from high 
school at Mobeetie and serv-
ing more than three years in 
the US Navy during World 
War II, Seitz received his 
degree from Texas Tech in 
1948. He worked with the 
FHA at Eastland during that 
year, and in 1949 began work 
with the SCS at Dalhart. 

He spent 10 years there, 
then was at Stinnett until 1969 
when he was transferred to 
Perryton. 

Bids asked 

We envision a unique "country neighborhood" of beautiful estates 
with plenty of space for carefree living . . . large, attractive, energy-
efficient homes with equally attractive outbuildings for horses or -4-H 
animals . . . a neighborhood "common" area for recreation, 
administered by a homeowners' association . . homesites with their 
own water and septic systems, at footage prices no higher than city lots 
. . . the advantages of country living combined with the value of a 
restricted subdivision . . . a neighborhood such as Dimmitt has never 

Castro County received 
$497,200 of the State's $6,-
075,952,000 travel receipts in 
1976, a national study com-
missioned by the Texas Tour-
ist Development Agency has 
disclosed. 

The 1976 figures reflect an 
increase of 10 percent in 
travel receipts over 1975 when 
Castro County's travel busi-
ness accounted for $454,000. 

In addition to gross re-
ceipts, the study found that 
Castro County in 1976 had 17 
of the state's 227,258 travel-
related jobs, with an annual 
payroll of $91,000. 

It also estimated $19,800 in 
state and $4,400 in local taxes 
were paid by county visitors 
in 1976. 

The study wa4 done by the 
US Travel Data Center in 
Washington, D.C., an inde-
pendent travel research or-
ganization funded jointly by 
public and private sectors. 

It was based on the Cen-
ter's Travel Economic Impact 
Model which breaks out a 
state's share of the national 
travel market on a county-
by-county basis. 

The model measures the 
economic impact of all travel 
involving overnight trips away 
from home, and day trips at 
least 100 miles or more from 
home. Thus it includes travel 
by Texans as well as out-of-
state visitors, for all purposes. 

It includes estimates of the 
traveler's spending at home 
in preparation for the trip, his 
spending en route, and that at 
his destination. 

Basic data for the model 
comes from the National Tra-
vel Survey, conducted every 
five years by the US Census 
Bureau, and from the Cen-
ter's own National Travel Ex- had. 

for mowing 
on highways 

Here are the school lunch 
menus for Dimmitt schools for 
Dec. 19-23. 

MONDAY — Ham, green 
lima beans, sweet potatoes, 
fruit, rolls, butter, milk. 

TUESDAY — Stuffed wien-
ers, creamed potatoes, green 
beans, pudding, rolls, butter, 
milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Barbecue 
on bun, tossed salad, corn, 
fruit cobbler, milk. 

THURSDAY — Turkey and 
dressing, cranberry sauce, 
green peas, date cake, butter, 
milk. 

FRIDAY — Sandwich tray, 
lettuce pickles, potato chips, 
peanut cluster, oranges, milk. 

Plainsmen Estates will be a large new development located 1.6 miles 
west of Dimmitt. If you are interested in a new concept in carefree 
living that costs no more, you may study the plans and plats today in 
our office. 

Firemen slate 
turkey shoot 

105 E. Bedford 
Office 647-3519 
Home 647-3356 

HUCK ABAY 
ABSTRACT CO. 

	amilamalaillawamaaan. 

The Dimmitt Volunteer Fire 
Department will sponsor a 
turkey shoot beginning at 1 
p.m. Sunday at the municipal 
airport. 

Firemen invite all marks-
men of the area to compete, 
and announce that shells will 
be available. 

The weakness of the dollar 
overseas has a number of 
people disturbed. Just how 
serious is it? The long range 
effect of a weak dollar on our 
trade position is favorable. 
The possible effect on infla-
tion in this country is quite 
serious. 

The weakness of the dollar 
is due for the most part to a 
massive balance of payments 
deficit. This deficit is caused 
by the continued imports of 
foreign crude oil coupled with 
weak foreign sales of US pro-
ducts overseas. The recent 
dock strike which halted the 
shipment of containerized car-
go in East and Gulf Coast 
ports aggravated the situa-
tion. 

Our high unemployment 
figures and the current state 
of the steel industry will add 
fuel to the efforts of politi-
cians to set up bathers 
against foreign goods coming 
into this country. Most of the 
industrialized nations are in a 
stagnant state with low 
growth rates. Only Germany 
and Japan are running trade 
surpluses. Efforts to get those 
two countries to stimulate 
their own domestic economies 
have gotten only grudging re-
sponses. Japan, especially, 
has tough restrictions on the 
sale of foreign goods in Ja-
pan. 

Cutting back on US imports 
other than crude oil would 
weaken the economies of our 
overseas trading partners. 
However, it looks as if there 
will be further market agree-
ments limiting the imports 
into this country of TV sets, 
shoes and textiles because of 
political pressure at home. 
The other countries will just 

HAYS 

IMPLEMENT 

CO. 

International-Harvester 

Farm Machinery 

    

 

HOW'S YOUR CREDIT 

We'll be happy to answer 
your questions on the 
importance of a good 

credit record. 
Call us or stop in for a 

personal interview. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
116 W. Bedford 

 

FARMER'S 
SUPPLY CO. 

THE FINEST IN 

MillneOpOrIS-Moline 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO 

REPAIR 

 

Building 

Material for 

Every purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM 
BARTLETT CO. 

  

DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

{formerly Webb-Mears 
Engine) 

•King Offset Discs 
•Briggs & Stratton 
Sales & Service 

•Allis-Chalmers 
Phone 647-2573 

P.O. Box 576 

 

OVERHEARD: "My wife 
has an electric cooker that 
cooks slow and a microwave 
that cooks fast. Now if only 
she could cook." 

The State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation will take bids for 
right-of-way mowing and lit-
ter pickup contracts for 35 
units in eight maintenance 
sections Jan. 4. 

The maintenance sections 
are in Castro, Parmer, Hock-
ley, Lamb, Lubbock, Bailey 
and Hale Counties. 

The contracts will require 
the contractor to furnish mow-
ing equipment, personnel, in-
surance and other related 
equipment to mow the right-
of-way and pick up and dis-
pose of litter within each unit 
of each maintenance section. 

Most maintenance sections 
are composed of four or five 
units. The contracts will be 
for one year and a contractor 
may bid on as many units as 
he is qualified to handle. 

Anyone desiring to bid on 
this work or to secure addi-
tional information should con-
tact James W. King, district 
administrative engineer, or 
William M. Pope, supervising 
maintenance engineer at 601 
Slaton Road, Lubbock, or P.O. 
Box 771, Lubbock, 79408, or 
by telephone at 806-745-4411. 
Legal notices will be forth-
coming in all counties giving 
further details. 

The Texas Soybean Assoc-
iation is sponsoring the Texas 
Princess Soya Contest, to be 
held Jan. 28 in Plainview. 

Girls ages 18 to 25, who are 
directly interested in soy-
beans, are urged to enter. 

The state winner receives a 
$500 scholarship and a trip to 
the regional contest in August 
in Chicago. 

Princess Soya 
contest set 

CABLE TV 
BETTER PICTURE, 
MORE STATIONS, 
A Cable hook-up 

makes TV pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

DIMMITT 

TV CABLE CO. 
NO INSTALLATION 

CHARGE 

Phone 647-2364 



leetailliallelitlttli OOOOO 

4 - REAL ESTATE, 	i 
HOMES & LAND 	1 , 	  

PUBLISHER'S NOTICE: 
All 	real estate 	advertised 	in 
his newspaper is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise 	"any preference, 
imitation, or discrimination 

based on race, color, religion, 
iex, or national origin, or an 
ntention to make any such pre-
n-ence, limitation, or discrim-
nation." 
Phis newspaper will not know-
ngly accept any advertising for 
-eel 	estate 	which 	is 	in 	vio- 
ation of the law. Our readers 
ire 	informed 	that 	dwell- 
rigs advertising in this news-
paper are available on an equal 
opportunity basis. 

1-28-tfc 

THREE BEDROOM HOUSE 
for sale; one and three-fourths 
baths, 	fenced 	corner 	lot, 
sprinkler system, lots of extras. 
Call 647-4343. Go by at 1012 
Oak Street. 	 1-50-tfc 

FOR LEASE: 5. section, 3 to 5 
years, 	available 	Oct. 	1. 	Ph. 
276-5333. 	 1-50-tfc 

FOR SALE: 134-ft. frontage on 
Pine 	Street. 	Call 	Huckabay, 
647-3519. 	 1-33-tfc 

14x72 TRAILER and lot, 1972 
Kingswood, 	2 bedroom, 	car- 
port, 	6-foot 	fence. 	Call 	647- 
2273 or 647-2573. 	1-46-tfc 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 1825 
sq. ft. brick home, 3 bedroom, 
2 	bath, 	fireplace, 	newly 	re- 
modeled. 705 Maple. 647-3674. 

1-44-tfc 

SEE AND COMPARE: Three 
bedrooms, 	1 1/4 	baths, 	2 	car, 
garage, 	all built 	ins, 	lots 	o 
extras. Priced right. Huckabay. 
647-3519 or 647-3356. 	1-34-tfc 

	

_ 	. 
TWO BEDROOM house for 
sale by owner. For appointment 
call 647-5227. 	1-4-tfc 

HOUSE 	for 	sale, 	616 	NW 
Eighth. 	Two bedroctlCone 
bath, 	brick:asbestos 	exterior 
garage, 	enclosed 	back 	yar.. 
Available immediately; owner 
has relocated. 	647-4470 days, 
647-4427 evenings. 	1-7-tfc 

WANTED: good section to rent 
in 	Dimmitt 	School 	District. 
Would like liveable house but 
would consider any good sec-
tion without it. Call J. D. An-
derson at 276-5848 nights. 

l -8-4tp 

BY OWNER 
1606 	Sunset 	Circle 
Drive. 3 bedrooms, 2 
full baths with doub- 
le 	sink 	vanities, 
kitchen with long bar 
and dining area, lots 
of 	cupboards. 

647-3521. 

LARGE 3-bedroom brick 
with basement and 6 acres 
of land. Owner says sell! 

1-Section, 4 miles from 
Dalhart on pavement. 
Good water and priced to 
sell. 

1-Section in Hartley Coun-
ty, 8 miles from Dalhart on 
pavement and nice 3-bed-
room home. 

1/2-Section on pavement, 
nice home, east of Dim-
mitt, part in Castro County 
and Swisher County. 

One quarter north of 
Swisher County Feedyard, 
has large loan. 

1/2 -Section southeast of 
Dimmitt, good water. 

One quarter, Parmer Coun-
ty, strong water, on pave-
ment at Lazbuddie. 

CALL 
CHARLES VAUGHAN OR 

JACK COWSERT 

COWSERT 
REAL ESTATE 

Ph. 647-3650 
Nights call: 
Charles Vaughan, Broker 
647-5549 
Jack Cowsert, Broker 
647-2548 

The Castro County News 
647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 

Published each Thursday in Dimmitt, Texas, by the News Pub-
lishing Co., 108 W. Bedford, Second Class Postage Paid at Dimmitt, 
Texas. Publication Number 092980 

**************** 

When you list your 
home with George Real 
Estate, several sales- 
men will become your 
full time employees - 
List with us today. 

* 
* 	 * 

New Listing 
Lovely brick 3-bedroom, 
13/4  bath, fireplace, * 
glass enclosed patio, 
plus much much more. * 
Prime location. 

Available Soon- 3 bed- * 
room. 13/4  bath, 2 car 
garage, brick, only 2 * 

* years old. 

* 3 bedroom home in fine 
* location in south part of * 
* town. New carpet, large 
* kitchen, 13/4  bath, fire- * 

place, fence. Owner * 
* says sell today. 

* Call Today to see this 2 * 
* bedroom with beautiful 
* new carpet in all rooms. * 
* Attached garage with 31 
* carport. 

* 3 New Homes - All 
* completed and ready to * 
* occupy. Good financing * 
* 
* available. Luxury homes * 
* priced from $55,000 to * 
* $66,000. 

FARMS 
Castro County 

* One-half section 4 miles * 
* east of Dimmitt, 3 small * 
* wells. Owner finance. 

* One-half 	section 	10 
* miles southeast of Dim- * 
* mitt, Valley sprinkler, in 
* best of water. Two good * 
* irrigation wells. 

* Several other good * 
* farms, some dryland * 

and some in the best of 
* water. 
* 	 'p 

Lamb County 
, Farms from 120 acres to * 
320 acres in size. Good 41 
water and good terms. 	* 

Hale County 
3 farms - all in ex- * 

* cellent water, good 
* terms can be arranged. * * 
* We have other listings 
* throughout the area that 

may suit your needs. 
CALL TODAY 

GEORGE 
* 
* 
* * 

GLASS 
large stock of flat glass for-
combine and tractor cabs, etc. 
`Wholesale and retail on L-O-F, 
(Pittsburgh and Carlite wind-
;shield glass. Installed right and 
weather-tight. See Gene at 
Dimmitt Upholstery & Garage, 

1214 N. Broadway, 647-2534. 
6-52-tfc 

7-BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES [Compiled from the Commun-

ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth Am-
erican Legion Auxiliary.] 

DEC. 15 - Katherine Ack-
er, Mary Kiernan, Sonya 
Schulte, Josephine Ball, Tim 
Lust, John Wait Sr., Eldon 
Minchew, George Sides, Don-
ny Carpenter. 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to thank the 

nurses, cooks and other staff 
members of Plains Memorial 
Hospital for the excellent care 
they provided me during my 
hospitalization. Also, my 
thanks to Mary Sanchez for 
taking me to the hospital, and 
to Dr. Murphy for his ser-
vices. Thank you, and Merry 
Christmas! 

NATIVIDAD ORTIZ 
14-11-1tp 

GOD creates the world 
anew in each moment. 

-van Ruysbroeck 

Classifieds Get Results 

Irrigation Pipe 
Concrete or Plastic 

Underground 

Pipe Repair 
BACKHOE WORK 

945-2535 Day 
Nazareth, Texas 79063 

10-WANTED, MISC. 

I WOULD LIKE to rent a 
quarter or half section of good 
land with good water for veg-
etables in 1978. Prefer the 
Flagg area or south of Dimmitt. 
,Dale Maxwell, 647-4613 nights. 

10-4-tfc 

13-LOST & FOUND 

LOST: dark-rimmed glasses in 
light green vinyl case. Re-
ward. Mrs. Bob McLean, 647- 
4447. 	 13-2-tfc 

FOUND: Gift for the lady in 
your life. Boots, Omphies bed-
room shoes, new canvas bags, 
Sunglasses and Parfum's by 
Diane Von Furstenberg, Sun-
glasses by Carney, Kas Kat 
Mink Oil Kosmetics. All at 
NELLIE JANES. 	13-11-2tc 

reus Off ice of Traffic Safety 

•	 

6-AUTOMOTIVE 

FOR SALE: 1977 Honda XL 
75CC motorcycle, only 75 
miles, fully equipped. Reg. 
dealer price $529. Will sell for 
$385. Call 647-2386. Jan Baca. 

6-10-tfc 

S.FARM EQUIPMENT 

FOR SALE: 2 cotton trailers. 
Hog and cattle equipment. Ph. 
647-5517, Robert Duke. 

5-1-tic 

FOR SALE: 1962 M-5 Moline 
Tractor. Good shape, reason-1 
able. Ph. 647-2526. 	5-29-tic 

FOR SALE: Miller Offset  
Discs. For free demonstration' 
contact Farmer's Supply Co4 
647-3350. 	 5-41-tft 

3-FOR SALE  MISC. I 
FOR SALE: Two Selmer Bundy 
flutes new. Were $215, now 
only $165 each. 647-5496. 

3-10-tic 

'fRI-CHEM PAINTS. 647-2512T 
3-31-tfc 

HOMEMADE GIFTS for all 
occasions-bridal showers, ba-
by showers. Quilts and baby 
quilts. Senior Citizens Center, 
SE Third and Lee. 647-2654. 

3-39-tfc 

THE PLACE to fmd the right 
flowers, hanging baskets an 
gifts. Dennis Floral & Gifts, 
409 NW 4tb, Ph. 647-3197. 

3-44-tfc 

WILSON 
REAL ESTATE 
Southeast of Square in 

Dimmitt 
NOW OPEN FOR 

BUSINESS 

Like new three bed-
room, 13/4  baths with 
large den & living 
area. Very desirable lo-
cation. 

Redecorated 4 bed-
room house, 2 3/4  baths. 
New carpet. Priced to 
sell. 

Two sections dryland. 
Castro County. 

Several good irrigated 
farms in Castro. Par-
mer and Lamb Coun-
ties. 
1/2  section in Deaf 
Smith County. Owner 
finance. 

Several light water 
farms and good cotton . 
allotments. 

Half section northeast 
part of county with 
three-bedroom house, 
five small irrigation 
wells. 

Would like to handle 
your Farms and Ranch-
es, Homes and Con1-
mercial Property. 

Edd Wilson, Broker 
Phone 
Office: 647-4487 
Nights: 647-4345 

irenot 

Justice Real Estate 
115 West Bedford 

647.4101 	Night 647.5512 

Home Listings 
All our new homes include range, dishwasher, disposal, central heat 
and air, and 6-ft. Western Red Cedar fence. 

1634 Sunset Circle-3 bedroom, 2-bath home with approximately 1,725 
sq. ft. Corner fireplace, cathedral ceiling, large utility room, two-car 
garage, fenced yard. 

1610 Sunset Circle - 3 bedrooms, 2-baths, double garage, fenced, 
extra large den, and utility, fireplace, covered patio, formal entry hall, 
plenty of closet and storage, approximately 2100 sq. ft., two walk-in 
closets in master bedroom. 

720 Oak - Total Electric Home. Three bedrooms, two baths, utility 

room, fireplace. 

1012 Oak - Large three bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car garage, fireplace. 

Many, many extras. 

1602 Ruskin Circle-Three-bedroom home with two baths, fireplace. 

403 SW Sixth St. - Two-bedroom, one-bath home, freshly painted 
outside. 

Farm Listings 
HALF SECTION - One mile north of Dimmitt. Three wells. 29% 
down, 20-year payout. 

500 ACRES - Four miles northeast of Dimmitt. Eight wells with 1 1/2  
miles of underground tile. Only 15% down, with 20 years to pay off. 

160 ACRES-southwest of Easter. Good six-inch well. 

160 ACRES-Northeast Castro County. Dryland with four-inch 
domestic well. 

340 ACRES-Near Amey. Dryland. 

HEATING-COOLING 
COST TOO HIGH? 

Call 

Air•Tite 
Insulation Co. 

or see Robert Daniel 
647-2372 

We can save you ap-
proximately 30% to 
50% on your heating 
and cooling cost by put-
ting foam in the wall or 
between the brick and 
house, and cellulose in 
the attic. 

Don't Let Your Dollar 
Get Away-Insulate 

Today! 
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SELL IT MST/ 
cur IT sari 

••••4.5 

6 	-AUTOMOTIVE 
L _ 
FOR SALE: 1970 Chevrolet 
Impala, 4-door; also 1952 8x40 
mobile home. Ph. 945-2587. 

6-11-3tp 

1- REAL ESTATE, 
HOMES & LAND 

ir 	  
' 3-FOR SALE, MISC. 
OOOO OOOOOOOO 

WELDINt SUPPLIES rOxy  
gen acetylene welding rod 
goggles. Dimmitt Consumers., 

3-28-tic 

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom brick 
house, near school, 700 W. 
Bedford. Owner left town, must 
sell. Call 806-447-5858 or 2996. 

1-10-4tc 

FOR SALE: Mobile home, 14 x 
80, with 8 trailer spaces. 647 
2478. 	 1-7-tic 

IMPROVED 80 acres with good 
6-inch water and big older 
home for sale or trade for a 
dryland in Hereford area. P.O. 
Box 1134, Hereford, TX. 79045. 

1-8-4tc 

FOR SALE: 1976 Chevy Vega 
station wagon with air condi- 
tioner. 647-3394. 	6-11-4tc 

6  8-SERVICES 	1 

RENTAL color TVs. 8-51-ticKittrell 
Electronics. 

ARE ROACHES and termites 
Your unwanted guests? Cali 
Plains Pest Control, Amarillo,, 
PCL456PTL, 355-4341. 8-11-tfc 

DEAD STOCK removal, 7-day 
week service. Please call soon 
as possible. Hereford Bi-Pro-: 
ducts. Phone 364-0951. 

8-27-tfc' 

FARM DIRT WORK: Tailwater 
pits dug and cleaned, land 
leveling. Dump truck and front 
end loader work. Elevating 
-scraper work. Mumme Exca-
vating. Call 945-2255 nights or 
!early a.m. 	 8-15-tft 

'ALL SEWING and mending 
done. Also some alterations. 
Low rates. Call 647-3697. 

8-8-tfc 

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press Assoc-
iation, Panhandle Press Association and National Newspaper Assoc.  

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Year, $7.00 	School Year, $5.50 	Six Months, $430 

FOR SALE: Three repossessed 
TV's. Call Lenore at 647-31804 

3-8-tfc 
I NOW have Paterna Persian,  LOW MILEAGE '76 Chevrolet 
Yarn by Patemayan for needle- pickup, 6 cylinder 4-speed. 

$3,000. 938-2531. 	6-9-4tp 

1974 MERCURY Monterrey foi', 
sale. See at 727 Pine. This car 
is loaded. 647-5253. 	6-44-tfc 

point, also canvas books and 
needles. Classes available.. 
Mona Merritt, 647-5676. 

3-13-tfc 

'FASHION TWO TWENT11 
COSMETICS, Lorena Cates,' 
407 NW 3rd. 647-42103-41-30t 

FOR SALE: Baldwin organ. 
Full instrument keyboard. Call 
647-4450. 	 3-7-tfc 

FOR SALE: two-story building 
to be moved or torn down. 
647-2375. 	 3 9 tft 

FOR SALE: Two new student 
guitars with hardshell case. $40 
each, 647-5496. 	3-7-tfc 

'UHERMOPHORE (the auto: 
matic moist heat pack) by 
Battle Creek now available a 
Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tf 

ATTENTION: Are you needing 
to save on yours and your 
children's clothing needs? 
NELLIE JANES has "sneaked" 
in some Fashion Fabric. Watch 
for more. 	 3-11-2tc 

NEEDLEPOINT bell pulls, pi-
ano bench covers, rugs, pil-
lows, pictures, jeweled Christ-
mas kits, latch hook rugs, pil-
lows, stockings. Dan's of Can- 
yon. 	 3-10-4tc 

Monday, 10 A.M. 
Monday Noon 
Monday Noon 
	Monday, 5 P.M. 

Tuesday Noon 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	 Tuesday Noon 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 
Sports, Society, Church News 	 
Community Correspondence 	 
Personal Items 	  
General News, City and County 	 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house, 
401 NW 4th, Call 227-2087 
collect or 647-3242 after 5. 

1-11-tfc 
F 	 O SASO 

14-CARD OF THANKS 
t 	1_1 	_ _ • 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express 

our thanks and appreciation to 
all of those for their prayers, 
cards, food, phone calls, flow-
ers, visits and concern for our 
family during the illness and 
death of our loved one. May 
God bless each of you. 

THE FAMILY OF 
GEORGE DeLOZIER 

14-11-1tp 

2-FOR RENT 
	

1 
• 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
apartment, 1 1/2  baths, fully 
carpeted, built ins, carport. 
647-5606. 	 2-5-tic 

9-HELP WANTED 

INN WANTED at South Hills 
Manor Nursing Home. Contact 
Joyce Adrian, director of nur- 
	es. 647-3117. 	9-49-tic  

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE 
needed by agricultural market-
ing advisory service to sell ex-
cellent package of services to 
farmers and ranchers. Fulltime 
or part time. Good commis-
sions. Highly reputable firm. 
Ph. 806-792-6351 	9-9-3tc 

HELP WANTED: Bus drivers, 
both men and women. $200 per 
month minimum. Contact John-
ny Mason at 647-3101 or Morris 
Gowdy at 647-4607. 	9-52-tic 

BUILD YOUR own business 
with fast growing company. 
Highly effective products. Full 
or part time direct sales. Phone 
806-647-5517. 	7-10-tfc 

CARD OF THANKS 
NELLIE JANES says 

THANK YOU to the people in 
the Dimmitt area for your 
kind support. We wish you all 
a very Holy Christmas. 

TOM & NELLIE SHELTON 
14-11-2tc 

(RAWER SPACE for rent: Call 
Brenda Andrews, 647-2650 or  
647-5463. 	 2-18-tfd 

FARM HOME for rent. 3 bed-
rooms, 2 baths, north of Naza-
reth. Reply Box 63, Levelland. 

2-2-tfc 

titicILER SPACES for rent: 
Phone 647-2478. 	2-22-tfoi  

TRAILER SPACE for rent. East 
of City. 6474450. 	2-49-tfc 

BUSINESS LOCATIONS FOR 
LEASE, 2 buildings, 25X40, 
good condition. Ph. 647-3194. 

2-43-tk 

FOR RENT: Trailer spaces on 
pavement, hard surfaced parkJ 
ing area. Ph. 647-2177. 	1 

2-26-tic 

EXCELLENT QUAIL LEASES, 
Call 353-9858, Amarillo. 

2-11-2tc 
• 

8 	-SERVICES 
LADY VENUS ALOE VERA 
skin care and cosmetics. Jean-
ette Hampton, 709 W. Stinson. 
647-2516. 	 8-52-tfc 

ATCHLEY'S PET GROOMING. 
Grooming, cleanup and bath-
ing. Call for appointment. 
Susie Atchley.  647-2225. 8-3 tfc 

REPAIR OF ALL brand's of 
major appliances. Dimmitt Ap-
pliance Center, Jim Hrabal., 
647-5690. 	 8-7-tft 

LET US make you an estimate 
on Targonal bath and kitchen 
floors and walls. TROY KIRBY, 
647-5351. 	 8-37-tfc 

DEPENDABLE LADLES want 
to do paper hanging. Refer-
ences. Reasonable rates. Large 
or small jobs. Call Jimmie 
Middleton 258-7715 or Jean 
Collier 258-7396 at Hereford. 

8-1-tfc 

OO 

DEC. 16 - Durward 
(Butch) Strickland, Dale Ball, 
Bryan Huseman, Randy J. 
Huseman. 

DEC. 17 - Janice Allison, 
Dalia Sanchez, Britch Mad-
dox, Delton Watts, Joe Brock-
man, Tony Fritz, Dwayne 
Schulte. 

DEC. 18 - Jacalyn Thomp-
son, Darla Kay Young, Richey 
Behrends. 

DEC. 19 - Stephanie Ry-
an, David Melcher. 

DEC. 	Charlene How-
ell, Tom Finley, Curtis Ad-
ams, C. B. Lunsford, Dennis 
Kern. 

DEC. 21 - Kelly HoweH, 
Joe Lange. 	- 

DEC. 22 - Merrideth 
Hooper, Karrol Rettman, 
Robby Steffens, Germaine 
Pohlmeier, Vincent Braddock, 
Ivan Schacher, Chris Wagner. 

4-HOUSEHOLD GOODS 

CHRISTMAS SPECIALS: 20% 
off on all Kirby Vacuums, new 
and rebuilt, as low as $76.90. 
One Year Warranty. Any trade 
accepted. Rebuilt Electroluxes, 
$79.60, One Year Warranty. 
Other brands $15 up. Free 
turkey with each purchase of 
new and rebuilt. VACUUM 
CLEANER CLINIC, 800 Union, 
Hereford, 364-1854. 	4-11-1te 

USED KENMORE washing 
machine for sale, $25. Call 647- 
2659 after 5. 	4-10-tic 

SEE YOUR independent in-
surance agent for complete .in-
surance service. Ivey Agency, 
210 W. Bedford, 647-3518. 

8-6-tfc DRAG LINE SERVICE 
PIT CLEANING 

CALL 

CLIFF JOHNSON 
Hereford, 364-2111 

REAL ESTATE 
* 	Hwy. 385 South 
* 	Jimmie R. George, 

Broker 
* 	Office 647-4174 
* Gwen Bryant, 647-5509 
* Danny Rice, 647-3552 
* Dub George, 647-4469 
* Cobb Adams 647-2401 
******************* 

HOUSE FOR SALE: to be 
moved. 3-bedroom stucco. 
Huckabay Abstract Co., 647-
3519 days or 647-3356 nights. 

1-10-tfc 

DO YOU NEED your windows 
washed, carpets steam-cleaned 
or floors waxed? Business and 
residential. Call ABC Janitor- 
ial. 289-5597. 	8-3-tfc 

TREE SPRAYING, custom tree' 
and landscape service. T. J. 
Carter, Tex. lie. PCL-1440Pt-
LOW. Amarillo 373-4593, Dim-
mitt representative Randy Gilli 
land, 647-2448. 	8-23-tfc 

ON THE FARM tractor and 
combine air conditioner repair 
and service. JIM'S FARM A/C 
SERVICE, call 647-5310 or 
647-3127. 	 8-20-tfc 

TEXAS ENERGY has received 
another carload of barreled 
anti-freeze selling at $2.50 per 
gallon or $2.70 per gallon by 
the case, long as it lasts. Call 
647-2135. 	 6-10-tfc 

CARPET CLEANING - Also 
windows washed, floors refin-
ished. Prices competitive, un-
conditional guarantee. Dimmitt 
Janitorial Service, Warren 
'Finch. 647-4558. 	8-24-tfc 

PORTABLE WELDING. Com-
plete on the site. Danny Gools- 
by. 647-5401. 	8-45-tfc 

CHANTEL'S GROOMING SA-, 
IAN, 210 W. 5th, 364-2048, 
Hereford. 	 8-35-tic 

WANT TO DO custom work: 
listing, discing and chiseling. 
938-2544. 	 8-43-tfc 

WOOD AND CHAIN LINK 
FENCES, invest a little more in 
QUALITY, eliminate EXPEN-
SIVE repairs, financing avail-. 
able, estimates with no obliga-
tion. Contact Gene Sanders 
647-2477. 	 8-30-tfc 

FOR SALE: 71.2 acres good 
farm land located 5 miles east 
and 4 north of Dimmitt. Six 
inch well with underground 
pipe irrigates approximately 35 
acres. Well on natural gas, V2 

mile highway frontage on Farm 
Road 2564. Call 647-4619 be-
fore 10 a.m. or after 5 p.m. 

1-9-4tc 

IRRIGATED LAND 
160 ACRES of irrigated 

• farmland north of Hart. 
Good, level land with 
underground tile. Priced 
to sell. 

BEAUTIFUL three-bed-
room home in southwest 
Dimmitt, with almost-
new carpet. Priced reas-
onably, with good 
terms. 

• • • • it. 

LAND 
FOR SALE: 

900 acres southwest of 
Dimmitt. Eight irriga-
tion wells. Half section, 
230 acres, 200 acres, 
160 acres. 

Melvin Lewis 
647-5684 

LISTINGS NEEDED 
We're receiving many in-
quiries for commercial, 
business and residential 
property. Call us if you're 
interested in SELLING or 
BUYING property. 

CRAIG 
Real Estate 
Randall Craig 

112 E. Jones 	647-4223 
Nights 647-3271 

Meileat 

WESTERN AG SALES 
CO., INC. 

Broadway & Belsher 
Dimmitt 

Design, Sales and instal-
lation of: 
-PVC and Aluminum Pipe 
-Gifford Hill "360'' 

Center Pivots 
-STEEL BUILDINGS 
-ELEVATOR LEGS 
-GRAIN DRYERS 
-AUGERS 
-.GRAIN BINS 

"An Experienced 
Agribusiness Company" 

DIMMITT: 647-3188 
HEREFORD: 364-1266 



Metal Building Sales 

F If- D1RECT 
1 	1 

Buy Now And Save 

INDUSTRIES, INC. 
P.O. Box 1710, So. Hwy. 85 	Telephone 
Bernalillo, New Mexico 87004 505/867-2368 

TAILWATER PITS CLEANED 
Front-end Loader Style 

Mumme Excavating 
Nazareth 

945-2255 

Nights or Early Morning 

Conservation  

RWSWCD seeks nominations 
for conservation teacher 
Nominations are being ac-

cepted for the fifth national 
"Conservation 	Teacher-of- 
the-Year" awards program 
according to Earl Harkins, 
chairman of the Running Wa-
ter Conservation District. The 
competition is open to all 
teachers working at the kin-
dergarten through high school 
level who have developed an 
outstanding program of en-
vironmental education. 

The National Conservation 
Teacher of the Year will re-
ceive $1500 in cash and an 
expense paid trip to Washing-
ton, D.C. for the annual con-
vention of the National As- 

sociation of Conservation Dis-
tricts. The national second 
place winner receives a $300 
cash award. 

Co-sponsored by NACD and 
the Allis Chalmers Corp., the 
purpose of the awards pro-
gram is to encourage the de-
velopment of creative learning 
experiences in conservation 
for young people. 

"Any teacher in a public or 
private school in our con-
servation district who puts 
emphasis on environmental 
conservation as a regular part 
of the instructional program is 
eligible for nomination," said 
Harkins. 

NAZARETH 
DITCHING 
SERVICE 

Underground Irrigation 
and Pipe Repair 

KELVIN KLEMAN 
945-2550 Days 
945-2535 Nights 945-2228 

Interested teachers can ob-
tain additional information 
and nomination forms from 
the Running Water Soil and 
Water Conservation District. 
The awards program also in-
cludes equivalent prizes for 
the conservation district judg-
ed nationally to have provided 
the most effective stimulus 
and help for conservation ed-
ucation programs within the 
district. 

• 
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SAVINGS ON MUD 
AND SNOW TIRES 

'Traction Sure Grip,  
nylon cord tires for vans, RV's, 
light trucks. 

6 /OAS TT. 
bleraraii, LA T.. 
pia $2.4 Vit. 
N. trade needed 

• 

master charge .n..•.. 
a 

C A ANTHONY CO  
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Crops program set for area farmers 
and Furdan demonstrations 
on cotton and corn. 

Hottel added that the pro-
gram includes timely topics 
that are of interest to pro-
ducers and may help produc-
ers decide what to plant next 
year. 

All interested persons are 
invited to intend and the 
meeting should be concluded 
before 5 p.m. 

corn and grain sorghum. 
Olan Moore, county ento-

mologist, will report on Temik 

Hart Baptist 
choir will 
sing cantata 

A Christmas cantata, "Joy 
to the World" by John W. 
Peterson, will be sung Sunday 
night at the First Baptist 
Church at Hart. The public is 
invited to hear the musical 
presentation. 

Preston Upshaw, the 
church music director, is di-
recting the choir of approxi-
mately 30 voices. Several so-
loists will have parts in the 
cantata. 

The service will begin at 
6:30 p.m. 

Now Leasing 

WEST TEXAS 
MINI-STORAGE 

Lock it St Leave it 

647-3427 or 
296-6372 

A Crops Program will be 
held today (Thursday) begin-
ning at 2 p.m. at the County 
Expo Building, according to 
Charles Hottel, County Ex-
tension Agent. 

Four Extension specialists 
will be on the program to dis-
cuss topics of interest to pro-
ducers. 

Leon New, area irrigation 
specialist, will discuss "Lim-
ited Irrigation, Water Use," 
and give a report or irrigation 
demonstrations in the area. 

Dr. Zoel Daughtry, area 
agronomist, will discuss cul-
tural practices for corn and 
grain sorghum, which will in-
clude seeding rate, tempera-
ture response, water require-
ment, herbicides and fertility. 

Dr. Robert Berry, area 
plant pathologist, will report 
on corn disease demonstra-
tions, and other diseases of 

we drove by, and told us they were behind 
us." More than 30 state capitals were 
"swarmed" Saturday as American Agricul-
ture sought support from state legislatures for 
their goal of 100% parity. 

TRACTORS FORM UP for a parade in Austin 
Saturday during the "swarming" of the state 
capital by members of the American Agri-
culture movement. Rocky Kay, who took this 
picture, said Austin merchants "came out of 
their stores onto the streets and clapped as 

Hart, Nazareth enter tournaments 
urday are 1 p.m. for consola-
tion, 4 p.m. for third place 
and 7 p.m. for championship 
in girls' games; 2:30, 5:30 and 
8:30 p.m. for the boys. 

Varsity girls and boys from 
both Hart and Nazareth will 
compete in a tournament at 
Olton this weekend, while the 
JV teams are playing in a 
Springlake-Earth tourney. 

In the first round at Olton 
at 8:30 p.m. Thursday, the 
Hart Longhorns will meet the 
host team. The winner will 
next play the winner of a 
Cooper-Lockney tilt at 8:30 
p.m. Friday. Losers will clash 
at 2:30 p.m. 

Finals will be played Satur-
day, the consolation game at 
2:30 p.m., the third-place 
clash at 5:30 p.m. and the 
championship contest at 8:30 
p.m. 

Hart varsity girls will also 
play Olton, at 7 p.m. Thurs-
day, and winners or losers of 
the Cooper-Lockney girls' 
game Friday. Losers will meet 
at 2:30 p.m. and winners at 
8:30 p.m. The champs will be 
determined in a game at 7 
p.m. Saturday, after the third 
place game at 4 p.m. and con-
solations at 1 p.m. 

The Nazareth Swifts will 

	vio 	 
Excellent Christmas Gift Ideas 

for the Men in Your Life! 
• 

N 

, •67 

• • 
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Thursday We Will 
Be Open Til 9 p.m. G ODATEAIR 

have their first game at 11:30 
a.m. against Abernathy and 
their second with either River 
Road or Roosevelt Friday, 
winners at 5:30 p.m. and los-
ers at 11:30 a.m. Saturday 
games are for consolation at 
2:30, third place at 5:30 and 
championship at 8:30 p.m. 

The Swiftettes' first oppo-
nent will be River Road at 1 
p.m. Thursday. A win would 
pit them against the Aber-
nathy-Muleshoe winner at 4 
p.m. Friday. Losers are to 
play at 10 a.m. that day. 

The championship will be 
decided at 7 p.m., third place 
at 4 p.m. and consolation at 1 
p.m. 

JV girls and boys from Naz-
areth will begin play against 
Farwell teams Thursday, at 1 
and 2:30 respectively. They 
next meet winners or losers of 
Bovina-Sudan contests, with 
boys' losers playing at 11:30 
a.m. and winners at 5:30, the 
girls at 10 a.m. and 4 p.m. 

Hart Jr opponents in the 
first games will be Spring-
lake-Earth, girls at 7, boys at 
8:30 p.m. Thursday. Boys will 
play the winners of the Laz-
buddie-Amherst contest at 
8:30 p.m. or the losers at 2:30 
p.m. Girls' games are at 1 
and 7 p.m. 

Times for the finals Sat- 

4. 

Dimmitt, 
Texas 

3 pc. Vested 

Look sharp & feel great! 
Easy core, long 
wearing fabrics. 
Excellent fining, 

4.1 36 to 46, Reg. 
& Longs. 

solids or patterns 

2 pc. Suits, 
solids or stripes 

2 pc. & VESTED 
DRESS SUITS 

$59. 2 for $100. 
$79. 2 for 150. Suits, 

• 

/N 

It's Tire,Up Time For 
Light Trucks,Vans, RV's 

Long, Low Cost Mileage... 
Heavy Duty Strength... 
Nylon Cord Body... 
Choose The'Rib Hi-Miler' 

Juan E. Sauseda Jr. 

Student makes 

SAVE honor society 

DRESS SHOES 
Plus F E T. 
No Trade 
needed 

$2.85 

$3.44 

$3.26 

$3.94 

6.70-15 TT, blackwall, LR C, 
plus 52.41 f.E.T. No trade 
needed. 

Blackwell 	Load 	Regular 
	

SALE 
Sin 	 Range Price 

	
PRICE 

7.00-15/7 C $40.05 $35 

7.50-16/7 C $46.65 $40 
8.00-18.5/TL C $47.35 $42 

8.75-16.5/TL D S64.35 $54 

SAYE ON OTHER SIZES TOO! 

Rich brown and black colors, quality neo-
lite sole and durable rubber heel. Two 
classic styles. 
Sizes 6 1/2  to 12 

Juan Eliseo Sauseda Jr., a 
pre-law major from Dimmitt 
at West Texas State Univer-
sity. was recently inducted 
into Alpha Chi, national col-
lege honor scholarship so-
ciety. 

He has been named to the 
dean's honor roll every sem-
ester he has attended WTSU. 
Sauseda is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Eliseo Sauseda, Rt. 1. 
At WTSU he is a member of 
the Azteca Club and has been 
the co-recreational billiards 
champion the last two years. 

Alpha Chi is a co-educa-
tional society which honors 
college and university stu-
dents for academic excellence 
and exemplary character. 
Membership is limited to jun-
ior and senior students in the 
upper 10 percent of their 
class. 

Max Sherman, new WTSU 
president, was the speaker at 
the recent induction ceremony 
in which 67 students became 
members. 

4 

Long Sleeve PAXTON Tire 
It Service DRESS SHIRTS 

3 F« '10 • 
Polyester & cotton blends, great colors, 
two breast pockets. Sizes 141/2 -17. 

Hwy. 385 603 SE 3rd 

Dimmitt , Texas 79027 
Cal 647-4121 

Polyurethane uppers 
look like the finest 

leather but need no 
polishing. Wipe clean 

with a damp cloth. 

lead 
lip 
C 

C YOUR children need your 
presence more than your 
presents. 	—Jesse Jackson 
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