
The
Weather

Compiled by Pat Browii
rain hi lo

Sept. 20 80 58
Sept. 21 80 50
Sept. 22 87 55
Sept. 23 88 60
sept. 24 88 62
Sept. 25 .12 88 63

 ̂ Sept. 26 88 57
Rainfall for the month, 

11.66; rainfall for the year, 
26.77
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Auction Adds $8^906 
To Lions Treasury

ixr/1 t i r o c  r » n  < • ,» . t i . .  j  x _ J    .A capacity crowd was on 
hand September 21 to bid 
on items ranging from a 
case o f apple cider to a 
free night’ s lodging in 
Sutton County Jail. These 
generous persons were in 
attendance at the 39th 
annual Lions Club Auction 
held at the 4-H Center.

Lions reported that the 
sale brought an estimated 
$8,906.00 to the club 
treasury. This revenue, as 
in the past, will be used to 
support many needed 
community activities such 
as the 4-H Center, 4-H 
food show and dress 
revue, crippled childrens 
camp. Girl Scouts, band 
boosters. Chamber of 
Commerce, firemen’s 
training school, Concho 
Valley Home For Girls, 
4-H livestock and wool 
show, the community sign. 
Boy Scouts, the annual 
hunting party, welfare 
council. Little League 
baseball and the Sonora 
Speech Meet.

A barbecue started the 
evening’ s activities with 
goats donated by various 
Sonorans.

Lem Jones of Glendale, 
Arizona was again on hand 
to add his expert touch of 
auctioneering. The first 
item auctioned by Jones 
was a book of Citizen 
Band slang, donated by 
Jones himself, and pur­
chased by Bronco Phar­
macy for $40.

Almost every business

place in the city donated 
at least one item, some 
many more, to be auc­
tioned o ff at the sale. 
Other donors included 
ranchers who donated 
goats, and cooks o f the 
area, who donated their 
time and effort to produce 
delicacies made from their 
most treasured recipes.

The famous Mystery 
Package again this year 
led the auction with Mr. 
Haynie Davis paying $900 
for ownership o f the 
mysterious box. First 
donated in 1943, the 
gurggling box has added 
many, many dollars to the 
club treasury.

Many items brought 
over $100, including pecan 
pralines made by Mabel 
VanderStucken and pur­
chased by Joe David Ross 
for $135. A half day of 
bulldozing service from 
Carl J. Cahill, Inc., was 
purchased by the Hemphill 
Ranch for $135, and 
another half day went to 
Lea Roy Aldwell for $175. 
Mrs. Alvis Johnson’ s 
german chocolate cake 
brought $105 from Joe 
Kiowski as did a drench 
gun donated by Sonora 
Wool and Mohair and 
purchased by Edwin
Sawyer.

Sonora Floral and Gifts 
donated a plant which 
added $225 to the Lion’s 
treasury when Mabel 
VanderStucken bid that 
amount. A case of Coffee

from the Foodway Store 
brought $115 and a case of 
antifreeze from the Elliott 
Exxon Distributor was 
purchased by Charles 
Howard for $125.

Loads o f caliche from 
W.S. Anderson, Inc., was 
auctioned o ff to bidders 
Jamie Parker and Bud 
Whitehead for $100 and 
more. A vise from A&K 
Parts was purchased by

Leo Merrill for $175. One 
item that didn’ t go over 
very well was an overnight 
stay at the Sutton County 
Jail. Hershel Davenport, 
however, did pay $25 for 
the honor and it was noted 
that $25 was a fair price 
for any night’ s lodging 
that affords complete 
police protection and free 
breakfast.

Boys Vie In PP&K 
Zone Competition

i - i

Six Sonora youngsters 
travelled to San Angelo 
Saturday to compete in the 
zone competition of Punt, 
Pass and Kick, held at the 
YMCA football field. 
Those six young men were 
first place winners in their 
division at local competi­
tion held here September 
22.

Charles Reppond placed 
first in the 8-year-old 
division with a score of 83. 
Placing second in that 
division was Scott 
Reynolds with Eddie 
Ramirez placing third.

In the 9-year-old divi­
sion John Ponsetti placed 
first with 143 points. John 
also placed second in the 
San Angelo competition 
Saturday receiving a certif­
icate and football. Placing

second in that division 
locally was Terry Redding 
followed by Maurice 
Vickers in third.

Phillip Vargas was first 
in the 10-year-old division 
with a score of 144. Esau 
Ramirez, III was second 
place winner, followed by 
Michael Polocek.

In the 11-year-old divi­
sion, Manuel Perez had a 
score of 215 to place first. 
Terry Vickers placed sec­
ond and third place was 
won by Marney Sorenson.

Joe Shannon held a 
score of 195 to place first 
in the 12-year-old division. 
Following a close second 
was Cody Childress fo l­
lowed by Perry Don 
Drapper.

Louis Ramirez was the 
winner in the 13-year-old 
division.

Janice Grider, M ary G om ez, Kim  Cox, Nancy 
Mooney, Peggy Lynch and Gloria Gomez are always

4-H Ball Monday
The Annual Sutton 

County 4-H Achievement 
Party and 4-H Ball will be 
held at the Sutton County 
4-H Center Monday, Octo­
ber 4, from 6 to 10.

4-H members, 4-H lea­
ders and friends o f 4-H 
will be honored for their 
outstanding contribution to 
4-H during the past year 
at the awards program 
which will be from 6 to 7.

Pam Powers, 4-H Sweet­
heart, and John David 
Cook, 4-H Beau, for the 
1976-77 year will be 
honored at the 4-H Ball 
immediately following the 
awards program. “ The

C ountry C orp ora tion ’ ’ 
band, from Robert Lee will 
provide music for the ball.

Dress will be informal 
with boys wearing jeans, 
etc., and girls wearing 
casual dress.

Refreshments including 
punch, cookies and sand­
wiches will be served.

All boys and girls in 
high school and junior 
high school are invited and 
all 4-H members in 
elementary school may 
bring a guest.

4-H members, 4-H lea­
ders, and 4-H parents are 
urged to be present.

on hand at varsity and junior varsity games making 
sure that spirit is at an all-point high.

Firemen To Host 
Convention Sat,

The Hill Country Fire­
men’ s Association will 
convene here Saturday, 
October 2 with Sonora’ s 
volunteer firemen and 
their wives hosting. Some 
22 towns will be repre­
sented.

A business session is 
planned at the 4-H Center 
Saturday morning with a 
luncheon following at the 
Methodist Church Fellow­
ship Hall. Racing competi­
tion will begin at the fire 
hall at 3 p.m. Trophies are

This W eek’s
D E V IL

Lions Club Auction
Punt Pass and Kick 

Fed $ for City 
1977 New Cars Unveiled

Coming 
Next Week

Annualf

4-H Ball

QB Sneak Aids In Win Over Big Lake Owls
By Kay Holdridge

Ask Bronco head coach 
Bill Bundy what his 
favorite scoring play is, 
and he is liable to tell you 
“ a quarterback sneak.”

Sonora signal-caller 
John Elliott made the play 
click from a yard out three 
times in the Broncos’ 28-6 
crunching o f the Reagan 
County Owls.

The Bronco defense 
forced the visitors from 
Big Lake to turn the ball 
over on downs on their

first possession.
Johnny Creek and Garry 

Jones ground out most of 
the next 59 yards before 
Elliott followed Scott 
Brasher’ s block on the 
first o f his scoring 
plunges.

John David Cook’s PAT 
kick gave the Broncos a 
7-0 first quarter lead.

Dan Lawson’s intercep­
tion stopped the Owls’ 
first drive o f the second 
quarter, but Jones fum ­
bled after a three-yard

. . . . . .

I Í

Garry Jones became the first Bronco to break the 
100-yard barrier this season as he stepped off 110 
yards on 16 carries in last week’ s game against the 
Reagan County Owls.

pickup to give Big Lake 
the ball on their own 45. 
Two plays later, on the 
Sonora 47, Jennings Teel 
pitched back to Mario 
Hernandez on a perfectly 
executed option play, and 
the fleet Owl flew past the 
Bronco defenders to the 
goal line.

The Red Hoss line 
stacked up Don Thompson 
on the run for the extra 
point to maintain a slim, 
one point lead.

The hosts struck back 
quickly on a 74-yard drive 
with Elliott’ s one-yard dive 
again capping the push.

Big plays in the drive 
were a 10-yard blast by 
Creek, a 39-yard pass from 
Elliott to Gregg Parker 
and Jone’s 14-yarder near 
the goal line. Cook’s extra 
point kick was true and 
the Broncos held a 14-6 
lead.

The Big Lake offense 
bogged down after the 
ensueing kickoff and Teel 
boomed a 60-yard punt 
that Elliott returned 20 
stripes to his own 35. 
After a nine-yard scamper 
by Creek, Elliott again 
connected with Parker on 
a 56-yard TD bomb.

Cook’ s PAT was again 
good and the locals held a 
21-6 margin as the gun 
signaled the end o f the 
first half.

The third quarter moved 
slowly with both teams 
bogged down by penalties 
and turnovers.

The Red and White did 
manage to light the 
scoreboard shortly before 
the beginning of the final 
period.

Owl Britt Poyner let the 
pigskin slip through his 
hands on his own 24, and 
a host of red shirts 
pounced on the loose ball.

Manuel Lopez’ jitter- 
bugging 13-yard scamper 
and Jones’ nine-yarder left 
only that magic one yard

for Elliott to find.
Cooks PAT gave the 

Broncos a much safer 28-6 
lead.

The Sonora reserves 
moved the ball in spurts 
during the last period, 
chewing up precious time 
on the clock, while the 
defense, with help of 
interceptions by Cook and 
Billy Bob Galbreath, held 
the Reagan County offense 
in check.

Jones became the first 
Bronco runner to break the 
100-yard barrier this sea­
son as he stepped off 110 
yards on 16 carries. Creek 
rammed through from his 
fullback position for 40 
yards in 8 attempts from 
five-yard average.

Sonora Reagan Co.
20 1st Downs 9
261 Yds Rushing 145 
114 Yds Passing 95 
375 Ttl Yds 240 
4-9 Passes,Comp-Att 7-16 
3 Intercepted By 2 
2 Fumbles 2
9-95 Penalties 5-59
2-26 Punts-Avg 2-36

Absentee 
Voting 

Oct. 13-29
Absentee voting for the 

November 2 general elec­
tion will begin October 13 
and end October 29.

Those persons who plan 
to be out o f town or 
otherwise unable to go to 
the polls on November 2 
should vote by the 
absentee method at the 
office of the county clerk.

College students who 
will vote absentee should 
write to the county clerk’ s 
office for applications or 
have their parents make 
application for them.

Screwworm Outbreak
Screwworm cases in 

Sutton County have ex­
ploded over the past two 
weeks and ranchers re­
porting cases are to 
numerous to report.

Cases are being re­
ported in all classes of 
livestock. New born calves 
and sheep head the list 
but numerous cases are 
also being reported in 
goats, grown cattle and 
horses. Any animal with 
the slightest scratch ap­
pears to be a prime target 
for the screwworm fly 
which is operating under 
ideal weather conditions at 
the present time.

The screwworm problem 
is complicated by fall 
calving and the fall 
breeding season of sheep. 
Ranchers should check 
new born claves and rams 
daily and treat wounds 
with fly repellents to

Sonoran’s
Mother

prevent cases. All live­
stock should be sprayed on 
a regular schedule and all 
surgical operations, de­
horning, etc., should be 
postpones until after frost.

Ranchers are urged to 
continue to report all 
screwworm cases so that 
screwworm officials at the 
Mission Laboratory will 
know where the screw­
worm build ups are and 
will be able to concentrate 
sterile flys in these areas 
to help control the build 
ups.

Golf Tourney 
Planned

Eldorado will hold their 
End of the Rainbow golf 
tournament October 16 
and 17. Play will be three 
men, one woman teams 
with 18 holes on Saturday 
and Sunday.

There will be a happy 
hour at 6 p.m., followed 
by a banquet at 7 p.m., at 
the Eldorado Restaurant.

Entry fee will be $80 per 
team. Those interested in 
participating should call 
Mickey Rathbone, 853- 
2568 or Eddy Kinser, 
853-2369.

to be presented at the 
evening barbecue followed 
by a dance on the slab at 
the Community Park.

The dance is open to the 
public with an admission 
of $3 per person being 
charged. The Rydell Bro­
thers of San Antonio will 
furnish dance music.

The Sonora Fire Depart­
ment extends an invitation 
to the community to attend 
the racing events and to 
look over the newly 
renovated fire hall.

“ With the great support 
the people of Sonora have 
always given the fife 
department, this should be 
a great convention with 
lots of fun for everyone” , 
stated members of the 
department.

Emory Cain 
Dies In 

Wichita Falls
Emory B. Cain, 81, of 

Wichita Falls died Septem­
ber 22. Services were held 
Friday, with burial in the 
Crestview Memorial Park.

He was born February 
26, 1895 in Denton County 
and had resided in Wichita 
Falls 35 years. He was a 
member o f the Baptist 
Church.

Survivors include his 
wife; a daughter, Mrs. 
Gloria Broomfield of Wich­
ita Falls; a son, Dayton 
Cain o f Sonora; three 
sisters, Mrs. Elmer Phin- 
ney of Coleman, and Mrs. 
Bessie Morran and Mrs. 
Lena Johnson, both of 
Midland; a brother, Olen 
Cain of Midland; and four 
grandchildren, Angie and 
Dugan Broomfield, and 
Crags Cain o f Wichita 
Falls, and Scott Cain of 
Sonora.

Dies
Funeral services were 

held September 20 in 
Mason Funeral Home 
Chapel for Mrs. Willie 
Reichenau, 84, mother of 
Mrs. Mary Bolt.

Mrs. Reichenau died in 
the Mason Nursing Home 
September 18, Burial was 
in Grossville Cemetery.

Bom February 20, 1892 
in Greenvine, she married 
Willie Reichenau June 25, 
1927, in Fredericksburg. 
He died in 1959.

Surviving her besides 
Mrs. Bolt is another 
daughter, Mrs. Josephine 
Ritter o f Mason; six 
grandchildren, and nine 
great-grandchildren.

Fifty 4-H members, leaders, and parents participated in a “ clean-up day’ ’ at the 
4-H Center Saturday. The kitchen, rest rooms, trophy cases and equipment in 
the 4-H Center were given a complete cleaning Job. 'The livestock pens and bam  
were swept and watered down to prevent dust. The trees in the parking lot area 
were trimed and the grass and weeds on the unpaved paridng area were cut. 
Several loads of trash were removed from the 4-H building and grounds. The 
4-H Club and 4-H Leaders Association plan to hold another clean-up day at the 
Sonora Park Arena Sunday, October 10 at 3:00 p.m . The primary ohj^tlve of 
this clean-up will he to remove rocks from the arena and metal trimmings left 
from the constraction of the arena.
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G EN ER A L T IR ES  

D EPEN D ABLE  

SA FE

R .S . Teaff 
Oil Company

F IN A  G A S O LIN E

Phone 387-2770 
Sonora

TEDB HOT ONES -  Two new sporty, two-door models 
for the largest segm ent of the antomobile 
market-'Thnnderblrd [pktnred above] and LTD II—are 
among the mnltiple choice offerings from the Ford 
Division for 1977. The Thnnderblrd retains mnch of

its predecessor’s character, bnt is now a mid-size car 
with a mid-size price. LTD D, scnlptnred lean with a 
trim look, will be offered as a four-door as well as a 
two-door model. On display at Sonora Motors.

B  &  G Feed
FEED S A LT

con

M IN ER A L
L IV E S T O C K  H A U LIN G  

H A Y  H A U LIN G
Pasture Aide Liquid Feed will be delivered or' 

be picked up. Feeders will be furnished.

Phone

G EO R G E S C H W IEN IN G  
800 Glasscock  
Sonora, Texas

387-3620 387-2063 Res.

J 4 a p p ^
October 1

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Morris 
October 7

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Bryant

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Duhon 
October 9

Dr. and Mrs. Tom White 
October 10

Mr. and Mrs. Giles Hill 
Mr. and Mrs. Preston Joy 

October 14
Mr. and Mrs. Theo Cahill 

October 16
Mr. and Mrs. Ken Rosford 

October 21
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wallace 
Rev. and Mrs. Ray 

Nations
October 23

Mr. and Mrs. Prajediz 
Abila

Mr. and Mrs. J.C.

n n lv e rS a n ^
Stephen

October 25
Mr. and Mrs. A.C. 

Hudson

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Law 
October 27

Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Berry 
Mr. and Mrs. Andy Cox 

October 30
Mr. and Mrs. Elba Adams

Two new automobiles -  
the Thunderbird and the 
LTD II -  head the lineup

Thunderbird and LTD II Head Ford^s ’77 Cars
o f Ford Division’ s 1977 
cars, which are on display
at Sonora M otors, down-

Fred Campbell’s

Wool and 
Mohair Report

Doyle Morgan
Insurance — Real Estate

yes, we sell life 
insurance.

213 E. Main 

387-3912 

Sonora, Texas

In the Australian wool market last week prices 
firmed for all types being offered. The coarser types 
are still in strongest demand, primarily due to the 
shortages of offerings available.

Due to the extensive drouth in Australia, their 
sheep numbers have declined three percent and 
estimates of shorn wool have been reduced a similar 
amount.

Prices paid for New Zealand wools at their sale last 
week were up 2 Vi to 5 percent as compared to last 
week.

In this country, offerings are in f  irm hands and 
little trading is taking place. It has been estimated 
that as much as 80 to 90 percent of the U.S. clip has 
now been sold out of producer’ s hands. Prices which 
could be obtained on offerings are comparable with 
the year’ s high prices paid.

The Del Rio warehouses are holding sales this 
week and we will report the results next week in this 
space.

The big news is the mohair market was the decline 
in prices paid at the second South Africa sale in Port 
Elizabeth last week. The big decline was for kid 
mohair with lesser price reductions for adult and 
yearling. The local Texas buyers were pulled out of 
the market almost two weeks ago and no trading has 
taken place since.

While the drop in prices are not great, it could 
indicate that the market has now peaked. The small 
amount of mohair available should prevent a major 
drop in price.

Î SonoraBroncoFootball:
on

K V R N

Food Show 
Leaders 
To Meet

If you are interested in 
serving as a leader for the 
4-H food program, you are 
urged to attend a leaders 
meeting Monday, October 
4 at the County Extension 
Agent’s office in the First 
National Bank Building.

The meeting will begin 
at 10 a.m. If you are 
unable to attend the 
meeting but would like to 
be a leader you are asked 
to call the office at 
387-3101 and leave your 
name and phone number.

Jon Honea Mike Sipes Johnny Ramirez
Hear exciting Bronco football action live Friday nigbts at 7:45 p .m ., on TV 
Cable Channel five - A  service of KVRN Radio and brought to you by:

m'

Ken Braden Motor Co.

Bronco Pharmacy

Pettiet Auto Parts

Sonora Motor Co.

Carl J. Cahill, Inc.

Dairy Queen

Devil’s River Motel

Television Enterprises ♦
♦

Elect a 
Working 
Judge

Ronald L  Sutton
•  INDEPENDENT
•  QUALIFIED
•  IMPARTIAL

C e c il W esterman

W ould

Like

T O

Be

Y O U R

Pharmacist

DISTRICT JUDGE 
216TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT
Pol. Adv. Pd. By Ronald L .  Sutton  
P.O. Box 126 Junction, Texas

town Sonora.
Heading the list of new 

Fords are two all-new 
mid-size cars -- the 
Thunderbird, a two-door 
hardtop, and the LTD II, 
offering sporty-looking 
two-door models as well as 
elegant four-door models 
and station wagons.

The new Thunderbird is 
a luxurious mid-size car, 
and the LTD II is a stylish 
intermediate - size family 
car.

Other 1977 entries in­
clude the full-size LTD, 
The Granada, Ford’ s Hot- 
selling “ swing”  car; Pin­
to, America’s most popu­
lar subcompact; Mustang 
II, a small specialty car 
sales leader; Maverick, the 
proven, durable compact 
and the highly popular 
Econoline Club Wagon.

The 1977 Thunderbird is 
a specialty car on a 
114-inch wheel base. Over­
all length is 215.5 inches. 
The two-door hardtop 
Thunderbird offers high 
levels of standard equip­

ment, a quiet, comfortable 
ride and excellent 
handling.

Ford Division’ s other 
new mid-size entry, the 
LTD II, comes in three 
series. The base LTD II 
“ S”  and mid-series LTD II 
each feature a distinctive 
two-door hardtop, a four- 
door pillared hardtop and 
a station wagon. The 
top-of-the-line LTD II 
Brougham offers a two- 
and a four-door model, 
and the elegantly ap­
pointed LTD II Squire is 
Ford’ s high-series mid-size 
station wagon.

All LTD II models have 
a lean, sculptured look, 
yet offer six-passenger 
comfort.
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Calendars
A gift for now . . . and the future!

Tedford Jewelry
Downtown Sonora

387-2434
} 1975 Hallmark Cards. Inc.

For Local Service 
Call 387-2222

PHONE 653 4507

600 B LO C K  N .C H A D B O U R N L

SAN ANGELO. TEXAS

Place extra towel bars one 
above the other over the 
bathtub to hang stockings 
and underwear to drip drv.

My small son looks wonderingly at 
a bright red cardinal. And, for one 
instant, I glimpse' a bright mind in 
eager search, the wonder of intelli­
gence dawning. What an awareness 
of heaven is in my heart as I see my 
baby reflect God’s goodness and 
love! And what a deep sense of re­
sponsibility I feel.

How grateful I am for my church! It 
has helped me find answers, 
strengthened my faith. How comfort­
ing to be able to guide the religious 
training of my child as his questions 
grow in scope and depth!

More than anything else I want to 
share with him the wealth of love and 
understanding, joy and strength I 
have found in the love of God and His 
Church.

Sunday 
Isaiah 
5: 1-7

Monday 
Malachi 
3: 6-12

Tuesday 
Matthew 
25: 14-30

Wednesday 
Psalms 
47: 1-9

Thursday 
Psalms 
67: 1-7

Friday 
Isaiah 

42: 1-9
Saturday 

Isaiah 
43: 1-13

WE GUARANTEE THEM .

'e/lefn 
| A U r e / /  i

St. John’s ;|ii :
Episcopal Church i:|:; 

Rev. Ray Nations, Rector;»:;; 
Holy Com. 8 a.m.
Holy Com. 11 a.m. I;:;

1st and 3rd Sundays 
Morn. Prayer 11a.m. 

2nd and 4th Sundays

First Baptist Church
Rev. Clifton Hancock, 

Pastor
Sqnday School 9:45 
Morn. Worship 10:50aim- 
Training Union 6:00 p.ih.'§3 
Eve. Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Services 7:00 p.m.

First Latin American •VRev. Luis Estrada ;tv 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. iji: 
Worship 11:00 a.m. ¡Jj';
Training Union 5:30 p.m. j:?' 
Worship 7:00 p.m.
WMU, Monday 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Services 6:00 p.m. ¡J;;

First United 
Methodist Church

Rev. Paul Terry, Pastor jJi;; 
Church School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:45 a.m.
If you do not worship at 

some other church we’ll :•:<» 
be very happy to have tj'«  ̂
you worship with us. jJ;,

Church of Christ
Ron Fant, Minister i

Bible School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Youth Group 5:00 p.m. jlj’ 
Sunday Eve. 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Eve. 7:30 p.m. ::t:

St. Ann’s 
Catholic Church

Rev. Michael Fernandez 
Weekday Mass:
Tues., Thurs., Fri.

8:00 a.m.
Evening Mass:
Mon., Wed., Sat.

7:00 p.m. 
Sunday Masses 8:00 a.m

Scriptures selected by The American Bible Society 

Copyright 1976 Keister Advertising Service. Ir>c.. Strasburg. Virginia

•i: Kerhoiv Funeral Home
Neville'’s

Your Complete Dept. Store

The Ruth Shurley Jewelry Devil’s River News

S  “ For G od so  loved th e  w orld,
Southwest Texas 

Electric (cooperative 
Incorporated

Owned By Those It Serves
s

that h e  g ave h is  only  
begotten So n , that 

w h o so ever b elieveth  in h im  
sh o u ld  not p e rish , but h ave  

eve rla stin g  life.” 
— Jo h n  3 :1 6  

w ssssasiw sssss*»

I10:00 a.m. :;k
»Holy Day Masses

7:00 a.m. 
7:00 p.m

Hope Lutheran Chnrch
A.B. Wagner, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:20 a.m. i 
Worship 11:00 a.m. i 
“ The Lutheran Hour’ 
6:30 p.m. Sunday on; 
radio KGKL, 950. “ This ) 
Is The Life’ ’ 8:00 a .m .: 
Sundays on K C T V ,) 
Channel 8

The Church Of The 
Good Shepherd 

Preshyterian U.S.
Jim Miles

Sunday
Study Class 10:00 a.m. 
Fellowship 10:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Wednesday
Bible Classes 3 & 4 p.m.

Sonora Tabernacle 
United Pentecostal

Rev. Kenneth Doyle, 
Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m. ^  
Eve. Worship 7:30 p.m. 
Wed. Services 7:30 p.m.
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Fast Checkout... Friendly Carryout Service

F O O D W A Y
S u p e r '  M a r k e t s

The Beef People... Quality Meats
27 VOLUMES - Plus c  \  Specials Good

Rodoo Buckboord. Woter Adcied

Boneless Ham
Extro Lean "Sirloin Quality" .  $ | 3 9chopped Beef » I
Hygrade Smoked Center Cut  ̂V 98
Pork Chops u> I
F , .y  $ 1 1 9Beef Franks lb I

Reg. or 
Thick Sliced 

1-Lb. 
Pkg.

Winn/Dixie Sliced

Bologna99

Centennial Edition 27 VOLUMES - Plus %
Funk & W a g n a ls  2 VOLUME FREE D IC T IO N A R Y^

-  A inexpensive way to buildNEW ENCYCLOPEDIA a complete home reference library

VOLUME 1 - 49 . VOLUME 2-27 '2 .4 9  START YOUR SET TODAY!

Owen's Country Style

Specials Good
thru Saturday, Oct. 2, 1976

Right Reserved to Limit 
No Sales to Dealers,

Rind-On Smoked S lic e d  By the

Slab Bacon '"b
Wilson Certified

Sliced Bacon
Rodeo Buckboord

Sliced Bacon
Armour or Wilson Certified

Franks

Sausage 
$|39

Lb. I
O w e n s

O Kor AAoyer Sliced Reg. or Beef

Bologna
Fisher Boy Heat 'n Serve

Fish Sticks
Alex XLNT 3 Varieties

Burritos
Commodore light Batter Cod

Fish Fillets

$ 1  09 8-oz.
’ 7-“  '  Pkg.

ent

Boneless

Club Steak

Club Steak
$ 1

Jif
Peanut
Butter

Winn/Dixie 
Top Qunlity 
Reg. or Beef I Gooch

German 12-oz. Pkg.

O O cFranks vc Ot  I Sausage oX
Kimbell

Golden
Corn

Cream Style 
or

Whole Kernel

M axw ell House 
or

M aryland Club

G o l l ^

Frozen Foods
Kold Kountry
Pizzas

All Grinds 
1-Lb. Can 

Limit One With 
Purchase or 

More Excluding 
Beer, Wine & Cigs.

KoU Kountry

Hash Brown Potatoes
Kold Kountry

Stew Vegetables

Kold Kountry

Cut Broccoli
Golden Holly

Orange Juice

Featured 
Special !Kimbell Whole California Peeled _

Tomatoes 4  1
Del Monte Sweet

Peas Featured
Special!

17-oz.
Cans 8 9

Pearl
Beer

6 pack 12 oz. cans

$ 1  1 9

A ll Purpose

Crisep
riscoFINEST VEGETABIE SHOtinilN i,

3-Lb. Can

Vaseline Intensive Care

Lotion
TQc

10-OI. g  ^

Hair Spray
C o lg a te  Instant

Shave A
Delicious
Ranch Style

Beans
RAMCH
S T Y U E '
Be a n s

Dairy Features
—  Gandy's--------Orange 
Juice

'/a gal.

8 9 ^“  53*
Biscuits
Kraft Groted

Parmesan Cheese
Kountry Fresh American or Pimento

Sliced Cheese

SAVE 10
On Párchete of 16-et. Be

Snowy Bleach
Uetit One Ceueen

|C With This 
Ceupen

On Purchnte of 16-et. Bex Powdered

1 Ceupen 
Void âfter 10/2/7«

Ü
o

Kim Asst. Flavors

f F O O D W A V n i
V— rSiifWf' "A/.'ir A f f s

Dog Food 2'̂ co“ 2 9
3 AAinute Yellow

Popcorn

Kountry Fresh .Ch icken Noodle 
__  eCream of

A  H  ■ Kimbll Fruit

^11 CocktailSoup Mushroom 
•Cream of 

Chicken Featured 
Special '

10Va-OX.
Cans

Featured 
Special !

16-ox.
Cans M

‘̂0̂’ WSWtSlP ̂Mta.1. 1  2 3
R i c e  UT 1

" French
M u s t a r d  4 9 ^ ^

r
Smucker's

> l l y  . 9 9 *

 ̂ ,8 .0 , .  ^Jor
Kountry Fresh Smooth or Chunky

Peanut Butter 8 1 ^
____________________________________________________________ >

Bremner Ti>aflake 1-Lb. Be:

Saltine

C r a c k e r s  3 / 1

' ' S r a
Potatoes

U.S. No. 1 Russets

■  M  . A

X

^  Kountry Fresh Produce
Louisiana, Puerto Rico j i

Yams
231

Cranberries
1-lb. Box ^

Your Hometown Food Store... Home of Low Prices

10 lb. Bag

[Borden's Country Store

Instant Potatoes
20 oz. Box 7 9 .

I
Asst. Flavors ^

Hawaiian Punch‘d-

Kountry Fresh Produce^M  O

Bananas
Sunkist

Lemons
2 for

Pleasant Stores with Friendly Service
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Historical 
Association 

Sets Meet
The Edwards Plateau 

Historical Association will 
hold its annual meeting in 
San Angelo, October 2, in 
the main cafeteria of 
Angelo State University.

The meeting will be 
called to order at 9 a.m. 
Books written by authors 
o f the Edwards Plateau 
Historical area will be on 
display with some for sale.

The public is cordially 
invited to attend.

Maxine Holt 
To Head 

C F  Drive
Ms. Maxine Holt is 

leading the fight against 
crippling lung diseases in 
children. The job can’t be 
left to dedicated parents of 
C /F  and lung-damaged 
children alone.

Ms. Holt is organizing 
the Cystic Fibrosis “ Kiss 
A Baby Campaign”  now. 
Everybody can help. She 
will give you information 
on turning concern for 
these youngsters into 
active help to change the 
odds against them.

River News Thursday, September 30, 1976

S io ^ U a i

Patients receiving treat­
ment at Lillian M . 
Hndspeth Memorial Hos­
pital daring the period 
from Tuesday, September 
21 thru Monday, Septem­
ber 27 include the 
following:
Maria Quiroz 
Dona Stites 
Essa Hoover*
George Kisselburg 
Willie Andrews 
Anna Rose Gillit*
Mary Avis Carroll*
Ellen Heinen*
Mary Bruton 
Ray Waight*
Nell Brownlee*

Mem
C b v u v a l

A daughter, Brandi 
Marie, was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Harrell 
September 17 at Hudspeth 
Hospital. She weighed 6 
pounds, 12 ounces and is 
welcomed by a brother, 
Kevin, nine-years-old.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
McCallum of Hobbs, New 
Mexico are the baby’ s 
maternal grandparents.

Do you know of a handicapped child between  
the ages of 3-21— who is not in school?

Ernesto Gonzales*
Jackie Jones*
Raul Noriega*
Nellie Graves*
Nicholas Robledo*
Keith Nelson 
Esperanza Castillija

*Patient8 dismissed dar­
ing the same period.

S la p ^

iB e ttA d a ^
Thursday, September 30

Margaret Galbreath 
Linda Sue Smith 
Verna DuBose

Friday, October 1 
Corky Fields 
Mrs. Louis Powers 
Mrs. Louie Trainer 
John A. Trainer 
Roland Drennan 
James Ross Builta 
Mrs. Robert Driskell, Jr. 
Lisa Kay Trainer

Saturday, October 2 
George D. Chalk 
Mrs. Charles Howard 
Mrs. Nelson Stubblefield 
Darla Moore Berkley 
Enrique Noriega 
Mrs. Herman Pettiet 

Sunday, October 3 
Mrs. Leroy Whitworth 
Mark Shurley 
Bill Whitehead 
Lee Ann Byer

Monday, October 4 
G.H. Hall 
Alfred Schwiening 
Mrs. Belle Steen 
Bobby W. Granger 
Brenda Granger Bush 
R.L. Hardgrave 
Edward Gonzales 
Ruth Drennan Easley 

Tuesday, October 5 
Alvis Johnson, Jr.
Joyce Chalk 
Ernest Castro 
Ronnie Paxton 

Wednesday, October 6 
Mrs. Melvin Shroyer 
Libb Mills Wallace 
Ethel Olson 
Betty Jo Cooper

Chaos Club 
Hosted

The Chaos Bunko Qub 
met Monday night at the 
home o f Mrs. Rodney 
Knight.

Winning bunko was 
Mrs. Hoot Hearn; high, 
Lila Mae W ipff; second, 
Mrs. Curtis Weant, and 
low, Mrs. Doug DuBose.

Cake, chips, dips and 
drinks were served to 
Mmes. Archie Crenwelge, 
Pam Wilson, Scooter Mc- 
Minn, Bill Jolly, Rodney 
Knight and guests Mmes. 
Walter Walicek, Nolan 
Johnson and Bruce Gann.

Stephen Terry

Stephen Terry Chosen To 
National Merit Semifinalist

Stephen Terry has been 
selected as one of 15,000 
National Merit semifinal­
ists by the National Merit 
Scholarship Corporation. 
These high school seniors 
are the top one-half of one 
percent o f the nation’ s 
seniors, based on scores of 
the preliminary scholastic 
achievement test given 
them last October.

Approximately 90 per­
cent of these students are 
expected to attain finalist 
standing by meeting a 
number o f requirements 
this fall. Finalists are then 
considered for the various 
sch o larsh ip s  ava ilab le  
through the scholarship 
corporation.

Terry is the son of the 
Rev. and Mrs. Paul Terry, 
and is a senior at Sonora 
High School. He has 
maintained a 94 average 
throughout high school. 
He moved here from 
Charlotte where he had 
completed his freshman 
year as the highest 
ranking freshman boy. He 
has been chosen for 
district band on th e ' 
baritone horn three times 
in the oast three years and

Texas now provides 
for EVERY chUd.

a free public education

CHILD FIND is looking for these handicapped 
children. They may be mentally retarded, 
learning disabled, emotionally disturbed, or 
health impaired.

And when we find them, they’ ll be given services 
fitting their own personal needs.

Make the call that makes the difference. Call

CHILD FIND
(915) 653-7333, coUect

Tedford Jewelry
BRID A L R EG ISTR Y

Teannette Quick, bride elect of Gene Thompson 
DeAima Schwe^tner, bride-elect of Scott Campbell 

Pat Kinard, bride-elect of Bobby Lynn Dowell 

Mrs. Tim Thorp, nee Leslie Johnson

Phone 387-2434

: ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★  ' k ' k 'k  * * * * * * * * * *  ^ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ * * * * * * *

 ̂LesWhite Music t f Abilene Comes * 
% to Sonora for 2 big days m
j  Thursday and Friday J
Ì  Look for the Red Caboose at Foodway $ 
* for a ear load of piano and organ values ^

Was Now Save ^
1,265 995 270 J
1,895 1,495 400 M

New Baldwin spinet piano
New Baldwin organ with Funmachine

Many other Baldwin pianos and organs greatly reduced for our 
Caboose Sale in Sonora
See the Baldwin Funmachine Sale Priced...the instrument anyone 
can play...chords and rhythm with only one finger.

All pianos and 
organs factory 

warranty

RED CABOOSE
Parked in the

was named to the regional 
band twice.

Attending a number of 
solo and ensemble con­
tests, Terry has earned six 
medals and placed first in 
science at district and 
regional U.I.L. literary 
meets. He also attended 
the state meet.

Chemistry, English III, 
and outstanding bandsman 
awards were also won by 
Terry last Spring.

Having attended the 
National Science Founda­
tion sponsored seminar 
training program in biolo­
gy at the University of 
Texas, Terry hopes to 
enter Yale next fall. He 
plans to obtain a bache­
lor ’ s degree in biology 
then enter medical school.

Pat Garmon 
To Wed 

November 20
The engagement and 

approaching marriage o f 
Miss Patricia Ann Garmon 
and Mr. Charles Frye has 
been announced by her 
mother, Mrs. Bonnie 
Garmon. The bride-elect’ s 
father is the late W .F. 
Garmon, Jr. Mr. and Mrs. 
Harry Frye of Anson are 
parents o f the prospec­
tive bridegroom.

The couple plan to 
marry November 20 at the 
First United Methodist 
Church of Sonora.

Miss Garmon is a 1974 
graduate o f Sonora High 
School and is now em ­
ployed as district clerk for 
a transport company.

Mr. Frye is a 1966 
graduate o f Anson High 
School and is a local 
drilling firm employee.

Band
Booster’s

News
The junior varsity and 

both junior high teams will 
play here tonight (Thurs­
day). Those parents to 
provide two dozen sand­
wiches for the concession 
stand are Simpler, 
Mounce, Morriss, Law'son, 
Black, M. Hernandez, 
Wallace, and Short.

Parents to bring two 
dozen cupcakes are Mer­
rill, Mobley, Dominquez, 
Doran, and Galindo.

Friday, October 1, the 
varsity team will host 
Brady. Mr. and Mrs. 
George Wallace will be 
chairmen of the concession 
stand on that night. 
Parents working with the 
Wallaces are J.T. Hill, M. 
Hernandez, Turney Friess, 
Armer Earwood, Sue Tay­
lor, Lula Boyd, Phillip 
Cooper, Bill Doran, Luther 
Creek, Tino Dominquez, 
and Steve Short.

Parents to provide two 
dozen cupcakes each on 
that night are H.E. Hill, 
Creek, Elliott, T. Friess, 
and Dominquez.

ALLENS VISIT 
C .W . WESTS

Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Allen, III o f Azle visited 
with his grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. C.W. West, Sr., 
last weekend while on 
their honeymoon. The 
Allens also visited the 
Carlsbad Caverns and the 
Caverns of Sonora.

7 ot 7 Club 
Meets At 
Langfords

Mr. and Mrs. Clint 
Langford hosted the 7 at 7 
Bridge Club Saturday 
night at their home. 
Guests were served choco­
late cake and ice cream.

Attending were Messrs, 
and Mmes. Bill Saveli, 
Jamie Parker, Joe Neil 
Smith, James Alexander 
and Joe Lane. Mr. and 
Mrs. Warren Hemphill 
were club guests.

Winning high were the 
Hemphills; club high, the 
Savelis; travel, Parkers; 
and bingo, the Smiths.

Mrs. Brasher 
leasts Monday 

Bridge Club
Mrs. Wayne Brasher 

was hostess September 27 
to members of the Monday 
Night Bridge Club. Choco­
late pie and coffee was 
served.

Winning high was Mrs. 
Clayton Hamilton; travel, 
Mrs. Horace Hill; consola­
tion, Mrs. Frank Adkins, 
and bingo, Mrs. Joe Neil 
Smith.

Others attending were 
Mmes. W.H. Hill, Albert 
Ward and Bob Granger.

Bunko Club 
Meets At 

Tocker Home

An elephant drinks by dravy- 
water halfway up hismg

trunk and then 
down his throat!

squirting it

Young Keith Wallace was among the many visitors 
attending open house at the Doyle Morgan insurance 
office last week. Keith visits with M rs. Gene 
[Francis] W est, office secretary.

A bride-to-be's 
First Stop . . . .

The following brides and brides-to-be have made ^
’ their selections with u s ..................

Mrs. Tim Thorp, nee Leslie Johnson 
Mrs. Boh Brockman, nee Nancy Jones 
Mrs. Paul Browne, nee Ronda Hopkins 

Jeannette Quick, bride elect of Gene Thompson 
DeAnna Schwertner, bride-elect of Scott Campbell

STORE HOURS:
MONDAY-SATURDAY 9:00-5;00  

Phone 387-2755

4C-k -k ir -k 'k 'k 'k -^ ick -k -k -k -k ir -k -k -k -k -k ick î
*

Tuesday, Oct. 12
KING HIE 
WAUEl 
CREMIVE 
COLOR 

PORIRKIIS 
EOR ONLY

Kodak paper. For a Good Look at the Times 
of Your Life. _________^

Mrs. Nola Tacker hosted 
the Dirty Dozen Bunko 
Club September 22 at her 
home.

Winning -bunko was 
Mrs. Bettye Carre; high, 
Mrs. Shirley Snyder; sec­
ond high, Mrs. Carol 
M itchell, and low, Mrs. 
Tacker.

Others attending were 
Mmes. Penny Wadley, 
Joyce Vaughn, Kay Story, 
Clara Minatra, Gloria 
Gordon, Mac Holt, Terry 
Chandler and a guest, 
Mrs. Kay Patton.

Extra
Charge

for
GROUPS

NO
LIMIT

IA

« I PKIUKS HIDE OF CtlKDH. 
CUniU. DID. MOH UD Ml THE 

Him OKEIM IHEnUHElOWPliai!

SHUGART
C O L O

PHOTOS
Bronco Pharmacy

116 NW Concho

i  FOODWAY
^  Parking lot

t  THÜRSDAY and FRIDAY ONLY 
** * ************* ********

YOU CAN OWN A 
WESTERN AUTO 

STORE IN:
Sonora, Texas 

Memphis, Texas 
Abernathy, Texas

There is im opporuiniiy a\ail;ible in 
ihe above towns for a Weslcrn Auto 
Associate Store selling hardware, 
sporiinii goods, automotive supplies, 
furniture, refrigerators, freezers, wash­
ers. televisions. C.H.'s. ladios. other 
clecironiQ^. etc.
We will train you. help install your 
store and provide counselling after 
youTe open. Financing is available to 
qualified prospects. If you're interested 
in owning your own Western Auto 
Associate Store call this toll free 
number today.

800-821-7700 Ext. 818
Or write:

R. T. Renfro. VP. Western Auto 
2107 Grand Ave.. Kansas City, Mo. 6410R 
Be sure to provide your phone number 
and complete address.

NOW OPEN
Lots of Good 

Used Furniture
Good Used 
Appliances

SONORA GIFT 
and

THRIFT SHOP
111 Poplar

Corner Poplar and GlasscocK
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Introducing
Our new  store manager,
Les Robertson (right) and 
Gus Campos have rounded 
up big bargains to  celebrate 
Les* first w eek  in Sonora...Les 
invites you to  com e by and check  
out the best food  buys in  tow n . ^

Full cut

ROUND
STEAK
1 . 0 0

Boneless

ROUND
STEAK
1 .2 9 .

Van Camps grated
Tuna

% «

Schlitz
Beer 

. pk 1.39
• .1

Heinz A pple Cider]

Vinegar
g a l .  1 . 6 9

No. 2 Russet

Potatoes
10 lb . bag

Texas

YAMS
lb.

Del Monte
Tomato

Sauce
8 oz. 5 /^ X

Santa Rosa
PLUMS

lbs.

Golden Ripe
BANANAS

lbs.

S w ift Prem 
luncheon
Meat

1 2  O Z .  9 9 ^

Del Monte
Peaches
1 6  o z .  J t / 7 9 ^

Dove
Detergent
22 O Z .  b tl 76*
S w ift
Chili w/beans ol. 59'

Rama
Grape Jelly

32 O Z .  9 9 ^

Toni
Pizzas

9 9 «

S w ift 
Potted

Meat
3 o t .  5 / « I

Puss *n* Boots 
Fisherm an

Platters
15 oz. cans

5 /^ 1

Tired of carrying cash or check book? 
W hy not shop the convenient w ay? Use our handy 
coupon books, buy them  and use them !

BUY A  COUPON BOOK

AUTH0RI2Í5 USD* 
fO O D S 'A M P  

R f D 'M F I lO S  b lO R L

Boneless
Rump
Roast

X«2 9 ib.
Boneless

Pikes
Peak
Roast
1.09lb.

I Extra lean boneless
Stew  
Meat1. 09. .

Extra lean

Cutlets
1. 49 .

Extra lean

Ground
Meat

Kraft
Philadelphia

Cream
Cheese

49*

8 oz.

ea.

MIX OR MATCH
Del Monte
Corn
17 
oz. 3 /« I

Ranch style
Pinto Beans

3 /* l15 oz.

Hunts ^
Fruit Cocktail ** 3/^1

Staff w h ole  16 oz.
Tomatoes 3/^1

Carnation
evaporated
Milk 

o‘ x . 3 / ^ 1
Hunts
Tomato Sauce

1 6  o * .  3 / ^ 1 '

Reynolds W rap ^
l u m i m u i ^ o n  3 / ^ 1

FOOD CENTER
600 Crockett Ave 

387-3438 
Home owned and operated
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Joyce Noriega was named president of the D .E ,C ,A . 
when they elected officers for the 76-77 school year. 
Named as vice president was Lisa Gonzales and Abby 
Sanchez was named secretary. Lonis M ata was 
elected treasurer and Linda C a s^ e ja  [not pictured] Is

the club’s reporter. Joyce Is a senior and is employed 
at the Foodway Store. Lisa, also a senior worics at 
Nevilles and Abby, a Junior student, works at KVRN. 
Louis works at Food Center and Is a SHS senior, 
while Linda, who works at Whites Is also a senior.

S C H O O L

LUNCH M ENU
Monday, October 4

Chili Dog 
Pinto Beans 
Fruit 
Pudding 
Milk

Tuesday, October 5
Meat and Spaghetti
Buttered Green Beans
Green Salad
Corn Bread
Cake
Milk

Wednesday, October 6
Barbecue Beef on Bun
Buttered Com
Lettuce, Tomatoes, Onions
Oatmeal Squares
Milk

Thursday, October 7

Turkey, dressing, gravy 
Cranberry Sauce 
Sweet Potatoes 
Jellied Fruit Salad 
Milk

Friday, October 8
Fried Fish
Blackeye Peas
Carrot and Raisin Salad
Hot Rolls
Ice Cream
Milk

Junction Tech Sets Conference

Eighteenth century scientist 
John Dalton was made head­
master of a school at the age 
of 12!

See and Drive the New 
Generationof General Motors

Full Size
Cars at
Ken

\

Braden 
Motors

hifSb'

Oldsmobile 88 Royale, 4 door Oldsmobile 98 Regency, 2 door

Buick Electro Limited, 4 doorBuick LeSabre Custom, 4 door

Show Date 
Sept 30

New car debut 
Saturday, Oct. 2,
8 a.m. to 5 p.m.

FREE
soft drinks, 

coffee, donuts 
demonstration 

drives

Chevrolet Impala, 3 seat wagon Chevrolet Caprice Classic, 4 door

0t
.M m ¡

Pontiac Bonneville Brogham, 4 door

Live KVRN broadcast from 
our showroom floor, 
featuring Jon Honea.

FREE
gifts

while they last!

Ken Braden Motors, Inc

The 14th Annual Ranch 
Conference on range, 
research, and ranchers will 
be held Friday, October 8, 
at the Texas Tech Center 
in Junction.

The purpose o f this 
conference is to bring 
together ranchmen, techni­
cians, and others inter­
ested in ranch and range 
management in an effort 
to help solve some of the 
problems facing today’ s 
ranching industry.

These meetings will 
provide for discussion of 
the latest information on 
brush control, grazing 
systems, stocking rates, 
ranch investment, income 
tax proljlems on ranches, 
forage inventories, wildlife

management, range re­
seeding, poisonous plant 
problems and other points 
of concern on West Texas 
ranches.

Dr. F.M . Churchill o f 
Abilene Christian Univer­
sity is this year’ s program 
chairman. Rodrey Cham­
bers, District Conserva­
tionist of Soil Conservation 
Service in Junction is 
making local arrange­
ments.

Registration will begin 
at 8 a.m.

S<JT COL.^ ! jg jE O

Iced tea was invented in St. 
Louis, Missouri, at the World's 
Fair of 1904!

Bundy Heralds Brady 
As Large^ Speedy Team

IH-IO and Hwy. 277 387-2529

“ Brady is the type of 
team that has the potential 
to embarrass you,’ ’ stated 
Bronco head coach Bill 
Bundy. He also said, 
“ They are bigger than we 
are and have exceptional 
speed.”

Bundy said that their 
defense was outstanding 
against the run, but was 
possibly weak in their 
secondary pass coverage.

“ W e’re the type of team 
that doesn’t have any one 
standout player. We have 
to depend on team effort,”  
the head coach stated. 
“ Everyone will have to 
play well to beat Brady,”  
he added.

“ We need to establish 
our running gam e,’ ’ 
Bundy said. He also 
commented that the Bron­
cos would probably have 
to rely on John Elliott’ s 
passing, too.

The head coach was well 
pleased with the Broncos’ 
winning effort against a 
large Big Lake team last 
Friday night at Bronco 
stadium.

Bundy said that the 
Broncos established a 
strong running game early 
in the contest and that the 
blocking was especially 
sound on the tight end 
side of the game. “ The 
linemen are much im­
proved,”  the Bronco coach 
said.

“ We played a good
solid defensive gam e,”  
Coach Bundy stated. He 
was well pleased with the 
entire defensive unit.

“ The whole team has 
improved with every 
game,”  Bundy said.

Offensively, Bundy com­
plimented the entire corps 
of running backs. Manuel 
Lopez, who was out the 
first three games with a 
shoulder separation, came 
in to play a good game 
running the ball.

“ Manuel will give us 
more depth and speed in 
our offensive backfield, 
Bundy added. Zeke 
Gamez, also lost to 
injuries early in the 
season, came in late in the 
game and will add even 
more depth offensively 
and defensively, according 
to Bundy. “ Scott Brasher 
had an outstanding game 
blocking,”  cited Bundy.

Defensively, Bundy 
named Brasher and Ross 
Roberts as outstanding 
perfomers.

The main weakness in 
the Big Lake game was 
downfield penalties such 
as clipping and holding. 
“ The boys need more 
coaching in this area,”  
Bundy analyzed.

The Broncos will host 
the Brady Bulldog unit at 
Bronco Stadium tomorrow 
night. K ickoff time is 8 
p.m.

BUSINESS
AND

PROFESSIONAL
DIRECTORY
HOUSE PAINTING 

Commercial Residential 
Ranch

FREE ESTIMATES 
Felipe “ Tito”  Vargas 

Call 387-3205

Mario Duran 
Water Well Drilling 

and Clean Outs 
Phone 387-2752 

SONORA

MELVIN GLASSCOCK 
SHELL STATION 

Phone 387-2669 

West U.S. 290 Sonora

CUSTOM 
Carpet Draperies 

FREE ESTIMATES 
BROWN FURNITURE CO. 

Ozona, 392-2341

H & H FEED 
AND

TRUCKING COMPANY

Call 387-2806

Purina, Godbold, 
Sweclwatcr and 

ACCO Feeds

Cowtown Boots

ENEDINA’S 
HAIR FASHIONS 
330 SW Gonzales 
Phone 387-3342 

Open Tuesday—Saturday

TAN-DE 
BEAUTY SHOP

Sharon Kemp, Operator 
Becky Harris, Operator 
511 E. 2nd 387-2216 

Tuesday-Fridays 
MERLE NORMAN 

COSMETICS 
Maxine Locklin, 

Beauty Consultant 
Bettye Stewart, 
Beauty Advisor 

Call for demonstrations

THE POTTING SHED 
Old Highway 290 East 

7 miles-tum right 
PHONE: 387-3078 

Open Tnesday-Saturday

General Motors has done it for ’77...a complete new generation of cars!

Public Notice
Southwestern Bell, in accordance 

with the rules of the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, hereby gives 
notice of the company’s intent to im­
plement a new schedule of telephone 
rates in Texas effective October 7, 
1976.

It is expected that the requested 
rate schedule will furnish an 18 per­
cent increase in the company’s intra­
state gross revenues.

A complete copy of the new rate 
schedule is on file with the Public 
Utility Commission at Austin, Texas, 
and with each affected municipality, 
and is available for inspection in each 
of the company’s public business of­
fices in Texas.

Southwestern Bell
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F O X W O R T H
G A L B R A IT H

AUTUMN
SUP€R SP6CIALS

SHOP NOW THROUGH OCT. 2

Super Paint 
Values!

White Latex 
Wall Paint

gal. ^ 3 ^ ^  
White Latex 
House Paint

gal. ^ 5 “

Heavy Aluminum

STORM DOOR
No. 165

*33®®

~T

C R O P Ti
/ . y

/

Little Brown Jug
Old Fashioned Apple Cider

for only
•  1 Qt. 14 Fluid Oz.

•  Hurry Limited Supply!

iri $199

Fixture
Chrome Future  with white 
g lass shade 
Width 4 ’ 4"
Extends 8"
Uses one 100 watt bulb

Economy Flashlight Offer

99

Attractive 
Ready-to-Finish 
Particle Board 
Shelving 1 X 12 X 8

1 X 12 X 10 
1 X 12 X 12

$198
$ 2 «
$299 Cultured Marble Top on 

White and Gold Wood Base

$10 OFF!
This Rockwell Ball 

Bearing Equipped Saw
Now Sells For $ 2 ^ 9 9

Reg. 34.99*

X 17" $ 3 4 » »  
X 1 9 "  $68®® 
X i9 "  $88®®

Cattle Stockatle Panels
*15”

IVIodel 4511 
Ball Bearing Equipped 

7ÎÎ" Circular Saw
More jxiwer. 9 aniiis; .n8(K) rpin. ;i 
lénifie t(X)l. Ifi  ̂aitling cairacity, and 
packed with performance and safety 
features to get your piojects done 
faster. Model 4511.

•Based on manufacturer’s suggested list prtce.

P R IC E S  S U B J E C T  TO  M E R C H A N D IS E  ON H A N D

52" high, 16' long
Vi" Galvanized Steel spaced
4"x8"
Can't Sag! Can't Stretch!
No special corner posts or brace 
required.

Barbed Wire
iCommonly Known as Bob Wire) 

P e rie li S i , le I J i U j

Domestic
$18®®

F O X W O R T H
G A L B R A IT H
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Two ‘T'Jveready PJconoifet-’’ flashlights irlus four of 
.America’s best-selling fiatterieA...' “ Kveready” 
No. 9.')0 “ D” cells. Type o’i.o l, BP-2, The price is 
right:

Attractive Bathroom Vanity
A solidly-built vanity cabinet with a 
matching oval cultured marble top. 
Together they provide a durable, prac­
tical combination that will give your 
bathroom both beauty and grace.

■Ideal for the bath and 
powder room 

"Easy to install 
Cultured marble top that is 
easy to clean

' Mar resistant ■ decorator faucet
vanity base

Materials SONORA
Center c q n CHO and PLUM 387-2536

F O X W O R T H
G A L B R A IT H

AUTUMN
SUP€R SPECIALS

SHOP NOW THROUGH OCT. 2

Your Choice
Peach and 
Plum Jam

2 Lbs.
Other Flavors Available

2 V2 " Corrugation 
2 6 " Wide 
29 Gauge 
6 ' ■ 12' lengths

6'-7'-8'-9'-10'-ir-12' lengths

EASY TO INSTALL 4x8
Hardwood pan«'
Prefinished Paneling

99

'44per sq.

A

Turbine
Ventilator

Cover
•  cover your turbine vent 

and keep your attic heat 
in.

•  turbine covers help you 
save money & energy dur­
ing the viinter months.

Plumb

All American Axes

Ductape
?  X b (  , 0  
Wate'pf 'Of 
Vapo'P'u'jF 
Supe'StfengiB
Adhes vP Seals

COMPOSITION

ASPHALT
2 4 0  Seal Tab  

Standard  C o lors

$ 1 7 9 5

90 LB. SLATE 
ROLL ROOFING!'

Per Roll 
W hite

A
r

D in ton P atte rn

Hl:u k Bully w ith Polished B lades— it 
s f le i t  H iiko ry  Hamlles. H eads fo iged 
frimi hijrh (|Uality steel. Bit's tem pered  
to hold  s h a rp  edrre . P e rm a h o iid  — 
keeps handles tig h t.

W estern I ’ a tte rn 110® ®

SNAP CUT Tree Pruner
Seymour Smith SNAP CUT Tree Pruner. Newly designed 
tree pruner with reinforced malleable iron cast head for 
added strength. Rope operated through easy action 
pulley and compression coil spring. Cuts up to 1" 
branches. Two 6' jointed sections, quickly assembled 
and taken down. Hardened steel blade. Can be used 
either in 6' or full 12' lengths

$ 1 0 8 8

A sA.'VIES

FLORAL 
SHOVEL
» Lightweight, strong
• Forward turned steps 
for ease in digging
• Heal treated blade r
• Flame Toughened'  
ash handle

GARDEN
HOE

$444

• 1 piece lotged head-maximum 
strength
• Pertecl lor garden or tiowei 
beds
• Lightweight
• Chrome ferrule; Flame 
Toughened '” handle.

BOW
RAKE

$444
• Strong, 1-piece iorged head
• For yard and garden
• Curved teeth dished 
lo rake clean.

$499

Penta Treated Posts
•  T h e se  p ressu re-treated  p o sts  

will a ssu re  y e a rs  of se rv ice

•  Rot and Insect R esistan t

•  All popular s ize s  available

3'/2”  TOP 
6 ^2’ LENGTH

$169
ea.

2”x4” Studs
Perfect lor framing 

and building

each

Commode
There is no finer 
reversible trap 
combination. Fits into 
any modern fixture 
group. Easy to clean.

WHITE ONLY ^^3,

■4P"'

Made in USA

Steel 
Tee Posts

. A post made from the 
finest rail Steel Double Backed 
enamel coated

$ 2 9 9 9 “B” Grade

Includes clips

P R IC E S  S U B J E C T  TO  M E R C H A N D IS E  ON HAND

F O X W O R T H
G A L B R A IT H

ES SONORA
Center CONCHO and PLUM 387-2536^

13693391
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Joey Kirby relaxes on the sideline along with teammates in last Thursday’ s 
game when the local Junior varsity overpowered the Crane Golden Cranes by a 
35-0 score.

4-H Projects Enrollment Set
Enrollment for 4-H 

projects is now underway 
in Sutton County. Both 
agriculture and home 
economics projects are

being offered.
Ag projects include 

market lamb and goat, 
rabbit, horse judging, wool 
and mohair judging, horse

project, beef cattle project, 
range and grass judging, 
livestock judging, shooting 
sports project, automotive, 
and photography.

Home econom ics pro­
jects include foods and 
nutrition, clothing, and 
child care.

All of these projects are 
open to anyone between 
the ages o f 9 and 19. 
Contact the County Exten­
sion Office at the Bank 
Building or call 387-3101 
for more details.

Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service programs 
are open to all, irrespec­
tive to race, color, national 
origin, or sex.

^  ;

By Bob Granger
Ignited by Eddie Favi- 

la ’ s 85 yard opening 
kickoff return, the Sonora 
Bronco J.V. exploded past 
the Crane Golden Cranes 
J.V. by a score of 35-0 in 
Bronco Stadium last 
Thursday night.

The Broncos racked up 
three touchdowns in the 
first quarter to quickly 
show their superiorty in 
smashing the Cranes both 
offensively and defens­
ively.

For the second week in 
a row, the Bronco ground 
game surpassed the 300 
yard mark as they ground 
out 323 yards in 50 
carries. The Bronco offen­
sive line continually 
opened gaping holes in the 
Crane defense to spring 
Bronco backs for good 
gains.

The Bronco defense 
didn’t play second fiddle 
to the offense as they 
allowed only 64 yards to 
the Cranes. The Big Red 
defense had allowed only 
17 yards total offense until 
the final six plays when 
Crane garnered most o f 
their offense toward the 
end of the game.

Favila gathered the 
opening kickoff in on his 
15 yard line and went up 
the left side of the field 
behind a solid wall o f 
blockers to race 85 yards 
untouched to score. John 
Bautista added the PAT 
and quickly the Broncos 
were ahead 7-0.

On the Bronco’ s next 
possession, they drove 62 
yards in eight plays to 
score. A 27 yard burst by 
fullback Benny Granger 
moved the ball to the 
Crane 10 yard line. On the 
following play, tailback

il
J.V. quarterback Kent Cagle looks on as his defense 
holds Crane to 42 yards total rushing and only 22 
total yards passing In last Thursday’s game played In 
Bronco Stadium.

The Sonora Park Rodeo 
Committee is sponsoring a 
AJRA and Open Junior 
Rodeo October 15, 16, and 
17 at the Sonora Park 
Arena.

Performance times will 
be 8 p .m ., Friday and 
Saturday and 2 p .m ., 
Sunday.

Age groups will be 8 
and under, 12 and under, 
13-15, and 16-19. Entries

and money must be in to 
Mrs. Louis Powers, 108 
W. College by 5 p .m ., 
Tuesday, October 7. She 
has entry blanks.

All proceeds will go to 
the Sonora Community 
Park. There will be dances 
both nights. Friday night 
the dance will be at the 
4-H Center and Saturday 
night it will be at the Park 
Dance Pavillion.

Cody Saveli scooted 
around his left end to 
score the second Bronco 
TD with 6:35 left in the 
first quarter. Bautista 
stepped up and booted the 
PAT thru the uprights and 
the scoreboard showed 
Sonora 14, Crane 0.

After a Crane punt, the 
Broncos went to work on 
their own 33 yard line. 
Four plays later, tailback 
Jimmy Waters broke up 
the middle, broke two 
tackles and raced 46 yards 
for the third Bronco T.D. 
of the first quarter. Again 
the big toe of Bautista 
added the PAT and the 
Broncos were on their way 
by a score of 21-0.

A short time later, the 
Broncos mounted a seven 
play drive from the Bronco 
46 yard line. The drive 
was aided by a 15 yard 
penalty against the 
Cranes. Saveli picked up 
the final 15 yards as he 
burst thru the right side of 
the Bronco offensive line 
to tally the fourth Bronco 
T.D. Bautista put his 
fourth PAT on the 
scoreboard to add the 28th 
Bronco point.

After holding Crane on 
downs on their 40 yard 
line, the Broncos struck

quickly as Favila broke 30 
yards to the Crane ten 
yard line. Three plays 
later Granger bulled in 
from one yard out with 
3:18 left in the second 
quarter. Dependable Bau­
tista stepped up and 
booted his fifth PAT of the 
night to send the Broncos 
to a 35-0 lead at halftime.

The Broncos threatened 
twice in the last half as 
they drove to the Crane 
nine and five yard lines on 
two occasions, but were 
unable to cash in on 
either.

The Cranes only serious 
scoring threat came in the 
second quarter as they 
recovered a Bronco fumble 
on the Bronco 24 yard 
line. The threat was ended 
when Waters intercepted a 
Crane aerial on the one 
yard line.

The Bronco J.V. will 
host the Ozona J.V. 
Thursday night in Bronco 
Stadium at 7:30 p.m.

Sonora Crane
17 1st Downs 8 
323 Yds. Rushing 42 
25 Yds Passing 22 
348 Tot Yds 64
1-7 Passes, Comp-Att 7-18 
1 Int By 1
3 Fumbles lost 0

Suffers One Loss To Crane
The eighth grade Colts 

winning streak came to an 
end last Thursday night 
when the Crane team 
squeaked by them 6-0. 
Controversial penalties 
and a sluggish offense 
kept the Little Hosses 
from scoring. Ronald 
Berkley and Steven 
Chandler provided spark 
to the offensive effort, but 
they were not enough to 
ignite scores. Johnny Doan 
also had a fine game.

Defensively, Robert 
Ponsetti, Wesley Barton, 
and Ben Ingham played 
well. Ingham recovered 
two Crane fumbles.

7th GRADE
The seventh grade Colts 

were victorious and contin­
ued their winning streak to 
3. The Little Reds beat 
Crane 18-0.

Ponciano Castillo scored 
two touchdowns offen ­
sively. Allen Stewart inter­
cepted a Crane aerial and 
ran it all the way to 
paydirt for the Colt’s final 
score.

The Colt defense was 
equally impressive in their 
third shutout in as many 
outings. Defensive end Joe 
David Favela and lineman

Junior Rodeo Dates Set
% Jk
M m

Winners in the local Punt, Pass and Kick Competition 
held last week and sponsored hy locally by Sonora 
Motor Company.

David Wills had good 
performances. However, 
the entire defense is to be 
commended for their 
strong performances.

The Colts will be at 
home tonight hosting 
Ozona. The seventh grade 
game will begin at 4:30, 
followed by the eighth 
grade, and finally the 
junior varsity.

Increase 
In State 

Expenses
Comptroller Bob Bullock 

said recently that an 
analysis by his office 
shows that state expendi­
tures have increased more 
than 50 percent during the 
last 10 years even after 
being adjusted for the 
effects o f inflation and 
population growth.

Bullock said total state 
expenditures actually rose 
from $2 billion in 1967 to 
6.2 billion in 1976, or more 
than 300 percent.

Y  e s ,  w e  h a v e  t h e  1 9 7 7  
F o r d  L T D  I I  i n  S o n o r a !
The Ford strike may be on, but you 
can still own your favorite Ford today!

NOW ON DISPLAY!!
Let us show you how 

easy it is to own one•••

Functional:
•  302 CID 2V V-8 (N.A. with California or high altitude 

emission equipment.)
•  DuraSpark Ignition.
•  SelectShift automatic transmission.
•  Power steering.
•  Power front disc brakes.
•  DirectAire Ventilation System.
•  Steel-belted radial ply 14" BSW tires.
•  Coolant recovery system.
•  Inside hood release.
•  Ford Lifeguard Design Safety Features.

1977 LTDH
A ppearance and Comfort;
•  C loth/vinyl bench seat.
•  All Vinyl door trim.
•  Color-keyed cut-pile carpeting.
•  Chrome-plated grille.
•  Dual rectangular headlamps.
•  Bright drip, window and windshield moldings.

FORD
SHOP AND 
COM PARE, THEN 
COME READY 
TO DEAL TO:

Sonora Motors
Downtown Sonora 387-3910

•  Deluxe sound package.
•  Cloth/vinyl flight bench seat with fold-down center 

armrest.
•  Deluxe door trim.
•  Woodtone appliques on instrument panel.
•  Hood ornament.
•  Opera windows (2-Door)
• Bright ,rear applique.
•  Bright rocker panel and wheel lip moldings.

F O R D
When America needs 

a better idea,
Ford puts it on wheels.



The Devirs River News Thursday, September 30, 1976 Page 9

Broncos To Host Brady Bulldogs
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Zeke Gamez Ross Roberts Mark Hemphill
Zeke Gamez is a 164 pound senior and wears 

number 23. He plays wingback and tailback on 
offense and halfback and rover on defense. Zeke 
played for the Broncos last year, also. He is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Max Gamez.

Ross Roberts, number 75, has done a fine job for 
the mighty Broncos this year. He is a transfer student 
and played on the Junior Varsity last year. Ross is a 
junior and weighs 195 pounds. He is a tackle on both 
the defensive and offensive squads. Ross is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Hal Roberts.

Number 20 for the Broncos this year is Mark 
Hemphill. Mark has played for the Broncos for the 
last two years. He plays fullback and guard on 
offense and plays end on defense. He weighs 155
pounds and is a senior, Mark is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Warren Hemphill.

Bo Carroll
Bo Carroll wears number 70 for the Broncos. He is 

a senior and weighs 185 pounds. Bo plays tackle for 
the Broncos, both offensively and defensively. He is a 
returning starter and has done an excellent job for us 
this year. Bo is the son o f Mr. and Mrs. Bill Tittle.

This page sponsored by the following Sonora merchants:
F oxworth-Galbraith 

Lumber Co.
Building Materials 387-2536

COMMERCIAL RESTAURANT
Mexican Food our Specialty 

“ Where friends meet to eat”
154 SW Plum

TEDFORD
JEWELRY & SPORTING GOODS

John and Bell Tedford 
Fine Jewelry -  Class Rings 
The Hunters’ Headquarters

r . O .  ■ »  7 H  S I N O I A , T E X A S  T i f S t

Doyle Morgan
Insurance - Real Estate

213 E. Main 387-3912
CARL J. CAHILL, INC. 
OIL FIELD CONTRACTOR

IN C .

D o w e l l
DIVISION OF THE DOW CHEMICAL COMPANY

B. J. (BOB) N U N LE Y
DISTRICT MANAGER

Sonora 
387-3526

Tenderness Is Sutton County Steak House  
SUTTON COUNTY 

STEAK HOUSE
1-10 & Golf Course Road 387-2328

Tim’s Liquors
open 10 a. m.-9 p. m.

512Croekett 387-3351

HNG 
PROPANE 
COMPANY
P. O. Box 647

GEORGE KELLOGG,
District Manager

Sonora
387-3539

Dairy Queen
387-2118

David and Sandy Ford, mgrs.

Texaco Self Serve
802 Crockett

7:00 a.m. to 9:00 p.m. Mary Greenhill Wingren

Sonora Motor Co.
Your FORD Dealer

Downtown 387-3211

■ wiRtime scPvcES ■

Sonora

DRESSER ATLAS DIVISION 
DRESSER INDUSTRIES, INC.

387-3531

we’re backing the Broncos!

GT TRUCKING
387-3460

G & L T O O L  C O M P A N Y
COMPLETE LINE OB FISHING AND RENTAL TOOLS 

387-3177 mobile 387-3989

THE SONORA AGL.NCY
BILL McC l e l l a n d —JAMES t . h u n t

210 E. Main
Sonora, Tx 76950 387-2676

Television Enterprises 
Inc. of Sonora

Cable T.V. 387-3344

W.S. ANDERSON 
& SON INC.

General Oilfield Constmcdon 
Dozer and Maintalner Work

—^  387-2858

Big Tree Restaurant
Sam DeChearo, Mgr.

Compliments of

FOOD CENTER, INC.
t

Home Owned, Home Operated

C.G. Morrison U
Variety Store ||

Lerondo Well Servicing Co. 1
Swabbing units, construction crews 1  

L.E. Brookover, owner 387-3502 I
Twin Oaks Motel I

Go "Big Red" I

BROWN ELECTRICAL 1 
CONSTRUCTION I

Sonora Eldorado I  
387-3316 853-2905 |

1 City of Sonora I
Home Owned W oter, Sewer & I 

1 Electric Systems |

BRIHAIN
Construction Company

General O ilfield Construction

Westerman Drug I
C ecil W estermon Would Like To I 

Be Your Pharmacist I

San Angelo Savings I 
Association 1

LENDER Broncos”  |

1 The Dairy Mart 1
1 Joella and Charles Graves 1 
1 Invite You To 1 
1 FAMILY DINING & FAMILY FUN |

Ken Braden Motor Co.
Chevrolet - Buick - Oldsmobile - Pontiac 

Golf Course Rd. 387-2529

The Ruth Shurley Jewelry I
John Roberts C lass Rings 1

GOSNEY'S
Famous Name Brands For Less

White's Auto Store
Home Decor Headquarters Armstrong Floor Coverings 

Carpet, Custom Made Draperies 
Free Estimates

Bronco Pharmacy
Joe Kiowski I

1 W e back the Broncos all the way!1 The Friendly Staff at

1 Neville's Dept. Store
1 205 N .E. Main 387-3131

Sonora Youth Center
Herman Moore

Country Fried Chicken 'N Fish
387-3748
FOR FAST SERVICE

Thompson's Texaco 
Service Station

Bill & Gene Thompson, Mgrs.

rUO J9P 5.



Page 10 The Devils River News Thursday, September 30, 1976

Don't sniff at a food you 
think may be moldy. This can 
send spores directly into the 
respiratory tract.

Joe Mike Egan 
Seeks Election 

To DA Position
Joe Mike Egan has 

authorized the Devil’ s 
River News to announce 
his candidacy as a write-in 
for the office o f District 
Attorney for the 216th 
Judical District in the 
general election to be held 
November 2, 1976. Egan’s 
victory over the present 
incumbent in Bandera, 
Gillespie, Kendall and 
Sutton Counties in the 
May, 1976 Republican 
Primary was not enough 
to offset his deficit in 
Kerr, (no Rep. primary in 
Kimble). Hence Egan’ s 
name will not be on the 
ballot in November and he 
is working to come back as 
a write-in candidate.

Egan, 48, took his law 
training at the Southern 
Methodist University 
School o f Law in its 
evening disivion, graduat­
ing in June, 1964 in the 
top ten percent o f his 
class. Order o f the 
Woolsack.

Upon graduation from 
law school, Egan left the 
Sun Oil Company where 
he had been employed for 
eleven years, to accept a 
clerkship with the Honor­
able James Noel, United 
States District Judge for 
the Southern District of 
Texas. He served as law 
clerk for Judge Noel for 
three years, from July 1, 
1964 until June 30, 1967. 
Egan then moved from 
Houston to Kerrville, 
where for the past nine 
years he has been engag­
ed in the general practice 
of law.

Egan said: “ While in 
Kerrville I have gained 
experience in trial and 
appeal of felony cases, as 
well as o f misdemeanors 
at the County Court level. 
In. my employment in 
Federal Court in Houston 
and Galveston I benefited 
from considerable oppor­
tunity to observe criminal 
trials from the objective 
view of the court, and 
particularly from concen­
trated experience gained 
working on federal habeas 
corpus petitions filed by 
state prisioners. I am 
licensed to practice in the 
State of Texas, the United 
States District Court for 
the Western District of 
Texas, the United States 
Court of Appeals for the 
Fifth Circuit, and in the 
Supreme Court o f the 
United States.

“ Our reason for moving 
to Kerrville was to make 
our permanent home on a 
place at the end of Goat 
Creek Road (about 6 miles 
out o f town, just inside 
Gillespie County) that my 
Dad, the late J. M. Egan, 
started working in 1948. 
My wife, Mary, is the 
third grade teacher at 
Ingram and our three 
children, Kathy (17), Mike 
(14), and Frances (13) 
all attend school at 
Harper. We are members 
of Kerrville’s First Presby­
terian Church and I am a 
member o f the Kerrville 
Rotary Club.”

“ I find politicing to be 
a humbling experience. 
Particularly in this write-in 
effort is brought home to 
me daily my absolute 
dependence on each of 
you. One summerlong 
anxiety I have been 
troubled with has, how­
ever, been relieved. Only 
recently have I learned 
that you need not possess 
the kind of memory 
supposedly enjoyed only 
by elephants to cast a 
write-in vote. Prior to 
leaving for the polls on 
November 2nd you may, 
yourself, make a written 
notation of my name and 
where it is to be written-in 
on your ballot. It is my 
understanding that you 
may then properly take the 
notation you have made 
into the polls with you and 
copy it onto your ballot. 
As you see, this is, again, 
asking extra effort of you. 
Herein, however, lies the 
difference between realis­
tic prospects of success or 
lack of them.”

Egan is of the opinion 
that the controlling issue 
for voters should be 
deciding which lawyer in 
the race would most likely 
give the state the best 
legal representation.

Pol. Adv. Paid by 
Joe Mike Egan

Dee’s Notes
by Dee NeviU

| r .  ^

Saturday morning the Yonth Football league met at 
the Bronco field to play their second game of the 
season. [Scores on the games were not available to 
the press.] This Saturday at 9:30 the Raiders and the 
Vildngs win start the play followed by the Chiefs - 
Cowboy game.

eo i^ , 
crovz
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There are 156 languages in the world, each 
which is spoken by at least one million people.

of
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Published Weekly on Thursdays 
Second Class Postage Paid at Sonora, Texas 

Exclusive newspaper serving Sutton County, rich 
ranching center o f the Edwards Plateau in West 
Texas.
915 Phone 387-2222 - 220 NE Main, Sonora, Texas 
76950. Entered as second class mail on October 18, 
1890, at the Post Office at Sonora, Texas under the 
act of Congress of March 3, 1879.

Yearly Subscription Rates-Due Each September 1 
Sutton County, $5.00 - Elsewhere In Texas, $6.30 

Out of State, $6.85

Wesley W . Burnett, Publisher 
Shirley Hill, Editor

MEMBER 1976 ASSOCIATION

Room To Grow 
„»Theme Of 

National 
4-H Week

National 4-H Week, 
October 3-9, will provide a 
challenge for youngsters 
across the United States to 
fulfill this year’ s theme, 
“ 4-H-Room to Grow.”

With a 7.8 percent 
increase in membership 
nationwide, this year’ s 
enrollment includes 5.6 
million young people be­
tween the ages of 9 and 19 
who will try to increase 
membership and leader­
ship during the weeklong 
observance.

“ National 4-H Week is 
scheduled annually by the 
Cooperative Extension Ser-. 
vice to bring public 
attention to the values of 
4-H as an informal, youth 
educational program that 
stresses development of 
practical skills, leadership 
and citizenship,’ ’ points 
out Dr. John T. Pelham, 
state 4-H and youth leader 
for the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Some 120,000 4-H
youngsters across Texas 
will also be participating 
in different countywide 
activities, notes Pelham.

Texas enrollment in­
cludes about 3,000 youth 
under nine years of age,
45.000 in the pre-teens 
(9-11), 46,000 in their 
early teens (12-14) and
24.000 between the ages 
of 15 and 19.

A little over half o f the 
Texas young people en­
rolled in 4-H live in towns 
with populations over 
10,000. The rest o f the 
youngsters live in the ever 
increasing suburbs and on 
farms.

“ The 14 Extension Ser­
vice districts in Texas will 
have different activities 
planned during National 
4-H Week in an attempt to 
attract new members as 
well as to encourage 
current members to ex­
pand their involement in 
4-H and thereby increase 
their learning experi­
ences,”  adds Pelham.

The Sutton County 4-H 
Club will hold its annual 
4-H Achievement Party 
and 4-H Ball at the 4-H 
Center Monday, October 
4, as a part of its National 
4-H Week observance.

* Create a garden effect 
in your spare room with arti­
ficial plant groupings, tall 
trees and hanging planters.

I
ELECT

ROBERT R. (BOB)

BARTON

DISTRICT JUDGE
216th JUDICIAL DISTRICT

The Candidate Of 
Proven Public Service

Pol. Adv. pd. by Joe H. Benson, Campaign 
Treasurer, 531 Fairway Court, Kerrville, Tex.

Chamber o f Commerce 
officers and directors will 
be meeting Monday at 7 
p .m ., at the Chamber 
office. All officers and 
directors are urged to be 
in attendance...and if you 
wish to come and visit 
with us..then, w e’ ll be 
glad to have you.

Bronco Boosters meet 
Tuesday nights at 7:30 in 
the Elementary School 
Cafeteria. If you are a 
Bronco Booster (and who 
isn’ t?) come and hear 
Coach Bundy give high­
lights o f thei previous 
games, along with some 
thoughts on the upcoming 
games. Our congratula­
tions to the Broncos for 
their win against Reagan 
County last Friday.

New home site's for 
teachers who living in 
mobile homes on comer of 
N.E. 2nd and Prospect are 
needed as the school 
administration plans to use 
the block o f land for 
expansion purposes. Dr. 
Joe Andrews said efforts 
are being made to find 
another place to house the 
mobile homes.

Another Oil related 
industry moving to Shurley 
Enterprises recently is 
CIC, who located there 
last week. Johnny Lipp- 
man is doing office work 
for the firm and says it 
will probably be three 
months before they have a 
telephone as (3E has 
underground lines to lay. 
A new face at Sonora 
Motor Co. is Paul Lipp- 
man, mechanic. The Lipp- 
mans are looking for a 
3-bedroom home if you 
know of one.

“ Let Thy fountain be 
blessed, and rejoice with 
the wife o f thy youth’ ’ 
(Proverbs 5:18) and this is 
what Leonard Gibbs with 
the bride o f his youth, 
Bernie, will be doing 
October 2 as they cele­
brate their Golden W ed­
ding Aniversary at their 
ranch home. Honoring 
them will be their children 
and grandchildren on this 
grand occasion.

Fae and Doyle Morgan 
were serving cokes, coffee 
and cookies as they held 
open house Friday inviting 
Sonorans to come by and 
see the location of Morgan 
Insurance Agency. The 
building is very attractive, 
and we wish them well in 
their new offices.

Western Union office 
has been relocated to P&S 
Shop and Save with 
Vicenta Cervantes per­
forming duties as local 
agent. Location is 102 
Main St...telephone num­
ber is 387-3915. WU 
service will be available 
daily Monday through 
Saturday, 9 a.m. to 9 p.m. 
Sunday hours are 12 noon 
to 9 p.m.

The Questions people 
ask of the Chamber office 
stimulate our own interest- 
so we begin serching for 
answers. Several recent 
inquiries as to our annual 
humidity have caused us 
to research this somewhat. 
No one seems to have info 
as the the annual rate. Dr. 
Johnny Fields at Sonora 
Animal Hospital tells us 
that during the past couple 
of months we have run 50 
to 65% humidity. Some 
days were as high as 80% 
(the day o f the 11-inch 
rain!) according to Bob 
Kelly who was instructing 
students at the airport as 
to density altitude and 
what it can do to an 
airplane. Dr. Fields esti­
mates that our annual 
humidity would probably 
average between 25 and 
35 % with some summer 
days dropping perhaps as 
low as 6 to 10 % .
Interesting, isn’t it, how it 
varies?

Bill Chapman out at 
Sonora’ s Municipal Airport 
said much damage was

sustained to radio trans­
mission equipment used 
for navagational purposes 
during the big rainstorm. 
Bill said direct lightning 
hits disrupted radio com­
munication equiptment. 
The equipment installed at 
a cost of about $7,000 is 
being repaired presently. 
Lightning really played 
havoc with several color 
television sets here also. 
Nelson Stubblefield of 
Sonora Electric thought he 
was seeing ‘the charge of 
the Light Brigade’ when 
all these folks came 
marching in with damaged 
sets following our recent 
electrical storms. He is 
still trying to come out 
from under the barrage.

Attending the Advisory 
Council meeting of the Big 
Country Area o f the 
American Lung Associa­
tion was Mrs. Dennis 
Dunnam, R.N.

A quote from Herbert 
Hoover: “ Blessed are the 
young, for they shall 
inherit the national debt.”

\

Johnny Creek takes a slight rest from Friday’s game 
against the Reagan County Owls.

City To File For 
Community Grant

The City Council o f  Sonora has 
determined to file an application for 
Community Development Block Grant 
funds.

A Public Hearing will be held 
Monday, October 4, 1976 at 10 a.m. in 
the City Council Chambers at City Hall 
to offer interested citizens an 
opportunity to aid the City Council in 
determining local problems eligible for 
funding and their solutions should the 
grant be received.

The primary objective o f the 
Community Development program is the 
development of viable urban communi­
ties by providing decent housing, a 
suitable living environment and expand­
ing the econom ic opportunities of 
persons o f low and moderate income. 
This objective is to be achieved through 
the elimination o f slums and blight and 
detrimental living conditions, conserva­
tion and expansion o f housing and 
housing opportunities, increased public 
services, improved use o f land, 
increased neighborhood diversity, and 
preservation o f property with special 
values. Thus, the program is versatile. 
A community, after determining its own 
problems, can determine how best to 
solve those problems itself.

Cities and counties, are eligible to 
seek these funds. The Dallas office of 
the Department of Housing and Urban 
Development which administers the 
funds has established a maximum 
amount available based on population. 
$100,000 is the maximum for which 
Sonora is eligible to apply. Because of 
the many applications filed, not all 
applicants can be funded. HUD has 
established a selection process which 
will help to determine who gets funded. 
That process requires HUD to review 
every application to insure that an effort 
is being made to satisfactorily perform 
previously funded tasks, to implement 
previously accepted housing plans, and 
that the current request is for activities 
which are eligible. If HUD is favorable 
to our application on those three factors, 
the application will receive points based 
on six items. The points will be totaled 
and funds will be awarded the cities and 
counties with the highest number of 
points. The six items are : 1) the extent 
o f substandard housing; 2) the 
proportion and extent of poverty in the 
area; 3) the extent to which the 
activities benefit low-or moderate- 
income families; 4) the extent to which 
the proposed activities expand or 
conserve low or moderate-income 
housing; 5) the effort to alleviate a 
serious threat to health or safety; and in 
some cases, 6) if the funds will be used 
to acquire other Federal or State grants.

Part of the requirements for obtaining 
the grant are that citizens be given at 

. least two opportunities to publicly 
express what they feel our local 
problems are and how they should be 
solved if this money is received. 
Citizens are also to be informed of the 
purpose o f the grant, the selection 
criteria, the citizen participation 
requirements, the funding limits, and 
the possibility that funds are not 
available to fund every application 
submitted.

The City in filing this request certifies 
to HUD that the program, if awarded, 
will be conducted in a nondiscriminatory 
manner. Also, the City would certify to 
the enforcement o f the National

Environmental Policy Act of 1969.
Activities eligible for the Community 

Developement program are:
1. For the acquistion of real property 

which is blighted, deteriorated, deterior­
ating, undeveloped, or inappropriately 
developed properties; appropriate for 
rehabilitation or conservation activities; 
appropriate for the preservation or 
restoration o f historic sites, the 
beautification o f urban land, the 
conservation o f open spaces, natural 
resources, and scenic areas, the 
provision of recreational opportunities, 
or the guidance of urban development; 
to be used for the provision of some 
public works, facilities, and improve­
ments; or to be used for other public 
purposes where necessary to the 
community developement program.

2. For neighborhood facilities which: 
a) are designed to serve a particular 
neighborhood and provide services for 
that area, or for the entire aea if the 
area population is less that 10,000; b) 
provide health, recreational, social, or 
similar services; c) may be either single 
or multipurpose in nature.

3. Senior centers.
4. Historic properties (including pri­

vate where public access is avaijable).
5. Utilities.
6. Streets, street lights, traffic 

signals, signs, street furniture, and 
trees.

7. Water and sewer facilities but not 
sewage treatment works.

8. Foundations and platforms for air 
rights sites.

9. Pedestrian malls and walkways.
10. Parks, playgrounds, and other 

recreational facilities.
11. Flood and drainage facilities 

where unavailable through other Federal 
programs.

12. Parking facilities, solid waste 
disposal facilities, and fire protection 
equipment and facilities under some 
circumstances.

13. For code enforcement in 
delineated areas which are deteriorating 
and where such efforts in conjunction 
with other activities may be expected to 
halt decline.

14. For clearance, demolition, 
removal, and rehabilitation of buildings 
and improvements.

15. For special projects which will 
remove barriers to the mobility of the 
elderly and handicapped.

16. For relocation o f families 
displaced by program activities.

17. Funds may also be used to 
provide other public services needed to 
support the community development 
program and for which other Federal 
assistance is not available.

18. Funds may be used to match or 
acquire other Federal funds for activities 
consistant with the program.

19. Also, for planning necessary to 
the development and completion o f a 
workable community development pro­
gram.

20. For reasonable administrative 
costs.

In completing the application for 
Community Development fiinds the City 
will need to determine local housing 
conditions and the needs o f local 
residents for various types of housing 
assistance both for owners and renters. 
Then a program on how the needs 
should be met will be submitted.

C L A S S IF IE D S
The City Council of 

Sonora has determined to 
file an application for 
Community Development 
Block Grant funds.

A  Public Hearing will he 
held Monday, October 4, 
1976, at 10 a .m ., in the 
City Council Chambers at 
City Hall to offer inter­
ested citizens an opportun­
ity to aid the City Council 
in determining local pro­
blems eligible for funding 
and their solutions should 
the grant be received. Ic5

For a Qualified Judge 
Elect Ronald L. Sutton, 
District Judge 216th Dis­
trict. (Paid for by Ronald 
Sutton.)_______________ l£5

Card O f Thanks
To the people o f Sonora 
we would like to extend 
our thanks and apprecia­
tion for help and kindness 
to our daughter and sister, 
Christine Cruzan, and to 
the people who have made 
donations to her trust 
fund. A special thanks to 
both her doctors and their 
wives. And to the hospital 
staff and the best nurses 
in the world, and last but

not least, our thanks to the 
Rev. J. Clifton Hancock, 
pastor of the First Baptist 
Church of Sonora, for his 
services and wonderful 

’  fidendship during our time 
of need while she was still 
with us. To all the people 
who sent flowers without 
an address our many 
thanks to you also.
The entire Alewine Family 

o f Sonora and elsewhere
__________________ ^
To everyone who was so 
kind to think of me during 
my recent stay in the 
hospital, my family and I 
extend our appreciation. 
Your many gifts and kind

thoughts hurried my 
recovery.

The Robert Taylor Family
___________________ ^
Words cannot express our 
deep appreciation to our 
Sonora friends for assis­
tance given the day of our 
recent tragedy; for expres­
sions o f sympathy, 
flowers, food, and memor­
ials, in the loss of our little 
daughter and grand­
daughter, Carrie Ann. 
May God bless you all, 

The C.F. Dacy family, 
Eldorado, and 

M.E. Nicholas family, 
Onona lc5



Experienced tire hand. 
Apply at Teaff Oil Co. 
387-2770.______________ ^
Need mature woman to 
babysit at either your 
house or mine. Call 
387-3624.______________^
Need qualified dependable 
bakerman to bake Mexican 
and French bread. 208 
New Street or 502 Glass­
cock Street. Call 387-2136.
__________________ ^

Inside work. Apply in 
person. Thorp’s Laun-Dry.
__________________ ^
Cooks, dishwashers and 
waitresses. Apply in per­
son. Big Tree Restaurant.

4c2

Help
Wanted

Wanted Giant Tire Serviceman—Large Contractor 
near Ft. Stockton needs serviceman to service all 
types of giant tires. Good pay, Lots of Overtime, 
many Benefits. Phone or Write E .C . Waggner or 
John Hufi, 2201 Airport Blvd., Austin 512-478-3412.

3p4

? ipif
u

Live Oak 
Phillips 66

mechanic on duty 24 hours, automatic 
transmission specialist, tune up and all 
major repairs.

OPEN 
24 HOURS

1002 SW Crockett 
387-2740

How dare 
6  ̂ we offer you 
^  five years

CPU. S

protection of 
your GOULDS 
submersible 
pump against

U(iHTNiN&?
. . .  Because Goulds submersible pumps are equipped with 
Franklin Electric Super-Stainless motors — the only kind that 
have built-in lightning protection! The SubSurance Protection 
Plan is available with a new Goulds submersible from us — 
to protect your pump for five years against the common 
enemies of long pump life . . .  corrosion, internal abrasion 
and even lightning. Goulds submersibles are built for long 
life ^  we can back it up with SubSurance.

ADCO Water Wells, Inc.
S o n o ra , Te xa s
915-387-2071 PnECmPUl
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ADS
Losi

A brown palamino, Shet­
land pony. Last seen on 
the draw on West Main. 
Has a long rope tied 
around the neck. Answers 
to the name Sunshine. 
Anyone who has seen or 
who knows where it is is 
urged to contact Peter 
Gomez. 403 West Main. 
_________  lc5

BUSINESS
OPPORTUNITIES

Man, woman or semi- 
retired couple interested in 
small business in Sonora. 
Light work. Contact Joe 
Williams, 204 E. 6th, Del 
Rio, Texas 78840. Phone: 
775-4900.______________^

Hunters Paradise 
Owner must sell 250 acres 
out o f Large Ranch.

$350.00 acre-big deer- 
turkey-Pinon Pine-Liveoak- 
Rugged and remote-Good 
for the talented unit. 
Owner. Contact Mr. Edgar 
512/232-5282, P.O. Box 
18, Leakey, Texas. Nights 
232-6643._____________ ^
6.3 acres by Owner-Near 
Kerrville, water, paved 
road. Lots o f Pecan and 
Oak Trees. $200 down. 
512/257-3001 after 7 p.m. 
and weekends.________^

Own your own mountain 
top, no down payment. 
Use o f spring lake, near 
Rio Frio and Leakey. Brice 
Properties, Box 436, Leak­
ey, Texas 78873. 512-232- 
5249, 232-5308 nights. 2c4

LET’S TRADE 
Do you have land that has 
becom e too expensive to 
Ranch? I have 5200 acres 
near Rocksprings, Texas - 
Would like to trade for a

ATTENTION
ROTARY OIL WELL 

DRILLING PERSONNEL
Large, international drilling contractor, operating in 
Algeria, Iran and the Persian Gulf area, offers 
Immediate opportunity for assignm ents in the 
following:

• DRILLING SUPERINTENDENTS 
9 TOOL PUSHERS
• DRILLERS
•  SR.MAINTENANCE SUPVS.

Applicants mast he folly experienced in these fields.
All assignments mlnlmnn 2 years. Married and/or 
single status. Liberal salary and benefit program 

j.Vlil«, attractive hump l,eaye schedule. Excellent 
' 'prospect for continued employment and growth.

Call or contact;
H. (Gene) Wilson or Bill Hall 
COLLECT: 214-748-9281

INC.

Cumberland Hill , 1901 N Akard  
Dallas, TX 75201

SPECIAL
23 channel Pace 143 -$79.95, save 160.00 
23 channel Pace 124A - $99.95, save 170.00

All other antennaes and accessories also discounted. 
W E GUARANTEE THE LOWEST PRICESl!

No one beats our prices

DISCOUNT SPECIALTIES
512 E. 2nd St. Sonora, Texas

place I can divide into 5 
acre tracts. Will also 
consider income property -

A
FOR SALE I

NEW 2 and 3 bedroom 
homes from 1,000 to 
1,700 square feet of floor 
space, built under city 
inspections.
IV2 or 2 full baths with 
ceramic tile showers and 
dressing tables. Large 
kitchen-family room com­
binations. Lots o f cabi­
nets and snack bar. 
Built-in dishwasher and 
range with hood. Utility 
rooms or areas. All gas 
or all electric. Central 
heating. Fully carpeted 
with window drapes 
installed. Completely fin­
ished and delivered to 
any place in West Texas 
area $12.75 per square 
foot. Can also brick all or 
part if desired and 
include refrigerated air 
all as an extra.

We invite you to come 
and look at what we have 
to offer. We have been in 
this business for over 20 
years and guarantee 
satisfaction.

CALL
CRAIG HARDEGREE 

Burley Lumber Company 
San Angelo, Texas

655-3127

WEST TEXAS REALTY
Offers

New Homes For Sale
by

DAYTON HOMES
Meadow Creek Addition 
3 & 4 Bedroom, 2 Bath

Ready For Immediate Occupancy

WEST TEXAS REALTY -  387-3437 (Day or Night) 
DAYTON HOMES -  387-3651

We Shake 
You Rake

Let ns shake 
pecan trees

your 
our

machine does a 100%  
Job. Call 387-2294 for 
more information.

BAND INSTRUMENTS
Rent-Purchase, Cash 
discounts. Fully guar­
anteed. New, Used, 
Parts, Supplies, Repair. 
“ Quality service to 
School Bands’ ’ . Gui­
tars, Amplifiers, Sheet 
Music.

McKlski Music Co.
609 S. Gregg 

Big Spring, Texas 
915-263-8822 

Store hours 10 to 6 
Saturday, 9 to 5

I PUBLIC NOTICE I
Major-Home

Appliance
has expanded their service to 
the Sonora area to two days 
a week.
TUESDAY-FRIDAY

Please call White's Auto, 387-3151 
or San Angelo 655-1013

Full factory warranty 
on all major brands.

- r '

y  7, ^
If I had to make a choice between
my CB radio and my Fuzzbuster, I'd 

CHOOSE TH E .”
Developed by a Speed Radar Manufacturer. Fuzzbuster is a 
self-contained, solid state, parametric radar receiver. Requires 
no antenna and no operator's license. Fuzzbuster responds 
to radar signals up to 3 miles distance with positive visual 
and audio warning. Half the cost of a good CB radio.

FU Z Z B U S T E R  parametric radar receiver by Electrolert.

8 9 9 5

WHITE’S AUTO
Downtown Sonora 387-3151

Oil and Gas income or 
leases. Floyd Price 512- 
896-5666, after six and 
weekends 512-257-5721.
___________________

For Rent
Office space for rent. Call 
Castle Court Corporation 
387-2461, between 9:00 
and 5:00. tfSl

Three bedroom, one bath, 
stucco house, living room 
and kitchen, also includes 
rental property. For infor­
mation contact West Texas 
Realty. 387-3437. tf4

Business
Services

ALL TYPES ROOF 
REPAIR and quality roofs. 
Kent Elliott Roofing. 
655-2800, San Angelo, 
Texas. tf32

Mobile home moving any­
where in the state. 
HATCH MOBILE HOMES 
INC., 2150 North Main, 
Junction, Texas. Phone 
915-446-2036. tf32

Just arrived - new lip and 
eye colors. Call 387-3758. 
Mary Kay Beauty Consul­
tant___________________ ^
Place your order for 
birthday, party, wedding 
or just good eating cakes. 
Also party mints. Call 
Clara Brooks, 387-3150. 
Orders taken Monday - 
Thursday._____________ 3c5
SAVE Big! Do your own 
rug and upholstery clean­
ing with Blue Lustre. Rent 
electric shampooer $1. 
White’s Auto Store. Ic5
FOR EXPERT HELP and 
quality home furnishings, 
see the friendly folks at 
B RO W N  F U R N ITU R E  
COMPANY in Ozona. We 
have “ everything for your 
home’ ’ ._______________ tf21
Clean Carpets give a 
healthier, more pleasanr 
atmosphere. Have you 
tried the STEAMLINER 
method? Let us do the 
hard work. Call 392-2654, 
Montgomery Ward, Ozona 
___________  tf32
APPLIANCE REPAIR and 
SERVICE - warranty ser­
vice on major brands and 
expert service on all 
makes. We service in 
Sonora every Friday. Call 
W hite’ s Auto, 387-3151. 
CANNON APPLIANCE 
AND REFRIGERATION 
SERVICE, Ozona, 392- 
2164.__________________ ^
Bulldozing for cedar and 
mesquite-all types ranch 
work and roads. Call 
387-2077.______________ ^

Attention
Ranchers and oil field 
personnel. Western Com­
munication Service is 
installing a Sonora Com­
munity Repeater System 
with up to 50 mile radius 
o f Sonora mobile range 
and up to 90-100 mile 
mobile radio control base 
or mobile range. If 
interested in the most 
economical mobile radio 
system available with the 
above coverage, call col­
lect Jesse Deaton 915/ 
653-3363. 4c3

GARAGE SALES
Saturday only. 8 a.m. to 
5:30 p.m. 510 Martin. Ic5
Today-Saturday. We’re 
moving ... washer, beds, 
mattress, water cooler, all 
household items. 611 Tom 
Green. ___________^
1005 Glasscock. Friday 
and Saturday. Starts 9 
a.m. Beautiful wedding 
dress, rollaway bed, 
stereo, typewriter, polo- 
roid, much more.______ ^
Clothes, furniture, dishes. 
Saturday and Sunday. 410 
Santa Clara.___________ 1^5

Livestock
Polled Hereford bulls. 
Ages 12-14 months. R.A. 
Halbert, 387-3356. Ranch, 
387-300A______________ tf5
Registered quarter horse 
gelding. 3 years old. 
Gentle. Will make good 
4-H horse. 387-2386 after 
5:30 p.m. ________  2c5

Angus bulls. Yearling 
2-year olds. Lots of length 
and grain fed. JUNO 
RANCH COMPANY Frank 
Fish. Call YJ4-6804 tf32

FR EE
Free Basset Hound-Border 
Collie mixed pups. Will 
make good pets. Call 
387-3091. Neal Ulmer. 3c3

36’ ’ gas range. Call 
387-2814 or 387-2301. 2c4
C.B. Base. Teaberry 
Stalker II. D104 power 
mike. See at 110 College.
__________________ ^
1974 International IV2 ton 
all wheel drive windmill or 
pump truck. Excellent oil 
field or pumping unit 
truck. Call 915-535-2234. 
___________________. Ip5
.Old printer’s type cases.... 
some dating to early days 
of Sonora...ideal for decor­
ating or for keep sakes......
limited number available... 
only $30 each. Metal hand 
set type 10c per letter. 
The Devil’ s River News, 
220 N.E. Main, Sonora.

nc4

Kenmore Dishwasher. See 
at Polo’ s trailer court. Lot 
4. $150.______________ 3£4
Electric range, 2 washers, 
1 gas dryer, 1 dishwasher. 
Call 387-3915 or 387-3250. 
Can be seen at P&S Stop 
and Save Store._______ 2c4

Don’t forget to see all the 
beautiful green plants at 
Saunders Greenhouse. Ic5
BOOM SPRAYER...heavy 
duty trailer, retractable 
steel third wheel, 200 
gallon heavy gauge steel 
tank. New engine and 
pump. Retractable side 
booms for traveling. Plus 
hose and gun for hand 
work. Ideal for bitterweed 
and livestock spraying. 
Call 387-2480._________ ^

12’ X 8’ storage shed. Call 
387-2965 or 387-2140. tf34

Mobile home, 12 x 55, 2 
bedroom. Priced to sell. 
Call 387-2480._________ ^

Reconditioned! 14 ft. wide, 
mobile home. No equity- 
assume payments. Call 
915-362-0222._________

In Eldorado. Corner of 
Brooks and Cottonwood. 
1971, 14 x 65 Tourite 
Trailer. 2 bedroom, 2 
bath. Air conditioned, 
washer, dryer. Call 387-
2100._________________ 2p4

RECREATIONAL
VEHICLES

Parts of a 1972 Suzuki, all 
or part. New tires. $50. 
387-2883 3c4

Like new, low mileage, 
1976 Buick Regal. AM/FM 
stereo with tape. Sunroof 
and good tires. Contact 
Michael Hale at First 
National Bank 387-2546. tf3
1965 Plymouth station 
wagon. Plus 6 cylinder 
Ford engine and 4 speed 
transmission. Call 387- 
2077.__________________^
1975 Chevrolet pickup with 
a pony coach camper. $200 
equity and assume loan. 
Call 387-2940. 2c4

$50. DOWN
1970 Ford LTD 2 door; 1973 Chevrolet Belalr 4 door; 
1969 Ford Pickup; 1971 Oldsmobile Cutlass. Call Pete 
at 653-4683, 420 South Chadboume, San Angelo.

For Sale
New 1976 Mercury Comet, 4-door, Automatic, Air 
Conditioned, loaded. $94 down, payments under 
$129.00. Taxes and title included. Ask for Lee or 
Eddie only. 944-2803.

For A  Belter Used C a r  or Pickup 

See
N ELSO N  ST . C LA IR

Concho Buick -  GMC

2400 Sherwood W ay —  San Angelo, Texas 
PH O N E 949-3797

1976 ¿lílff SAVINGS
7 6  FORD

BRONCO

FORD
TRUCKS
r

THE
LEAN

MACHINE
Take advantage of this year-end 
bargain...the ‘77 models will be 

officially out Oct. 1.

SONORA MOTORS
387-3910Downtown Sonora
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from  HISTORY’ S SCRAPBOOK
OATES AND EVENTS FROM YESTERYEARS

October 6, 1966
The powerhouse Bron­

cos picked up third win of 
the season by beating the 
Ozona Lions 33-0 Friday 
night in Ozona.

A girl was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. W. L. White- 
head September 21. She 
was named Lea.

Telephone numbers will 
have a different look when 
the new directory is 
delivered in November. 
The new system, knowing 
as All Number Calling, 
uses seven numerals than 
two letters and five

numerals as in the past.
Johnny Fields, working 

on his masters degree at 
A&M, received serious 
hand injuries last week 
while working in chemistry 
lab with a homogenizer.

Mrs. Jim Sloan of Irving 
and Mrs. Albert Ward 
honored their father, G. 
H. Hall of Quanah, with a 
surprise party in honor of 
his seventy-fifth borthday.

October 5, 1956 
Baldomero Favela, 26, 

was killed instantly Friday 
morning when his pickup, 
loaded with dynamite.

sbsSHUGART coupon as|
BRONCO PHARMACY

116 NW Conoho
Tuesday, Oct. 12

9
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS

99<t
ASK

About Our

Extra charge 
for

GROUPS

SONORA YOUTH CENTER
Paoil - Snooker - Pin BaU 

Air Hockey - - Deutscher Ball

Good Cleon Family Entertainment 

G A M BLIN G  & IN T O X IC A T IN G  L IQ U O R  
N O T A LLO W ED

Located On Main St. Sonora 
Open At 1 P.M. Daily 

Close At 9:30 P.M. Daily 
Except Wednesdays and Sundays

Owners: Mr. & Mrs. H.E. Moore

exploded about 22 miles 
south o f Sonora. Favela, 
who was an employee of 
Carl J. Cahill, Inc., was 
alone at the time of the 
accident.

Coach Joe Turner’ s 
Broncos took the McCam- 
ey Badgers apart to the 
tune o f 26-7 in the 
season ’ s most exciting 
football battle before an 
estimated 1,586 fans here 
Friday night.

The Fidelis Class met at 
the Baptist Church with 
Mrs. J. A. Cauthom and 
Miss Nettie Word as 
hostesses. Officers for the 
coming year were installed 
by Mrs. Pearl Crites.

October 11, 1946
The State Highway 

Department announced 
this week that it was 
opening an engineering 
residency here with C. C. 
Stroud in charge.

In action o f the City 
Commission Monday it 
was voted to give all 
full-time city employees a 
ten percent salary in­
crease.

Taking to the air after a 
ground attack had failed, 
A1 Boughton tossed a nine 
yard pass to Dickie Street 
for a touchdown last 
Friday night at the 
stadium to start the ball 
rolling toward a total 19-0 
win over the Junction 
Eagles. The Broncos are 
now seeking their first win 
over the Eldorado Eagles 
since 1930.

63 Years Ago
John M cKee o f Rock- 

springs was in Sonora 
Wednesday on a visit with 
his brother, Sam.

Postmaster G. W. Smith 
has moved his family into 
the Mrs. C. J. Nicholas 
place, comer of Main and 
Crockett.

Mrs. D. B. Cusenbary 
and daughter. Miss Hattie 
B., and son, Ben, left on a 
short visit to San Angelo 
Friday. Mrs. R. H. 
Wardlaw and Louie Stuart 
accompanied them.

Henry Diebitsch was in 
Sonora Saturday from his 
ranch northwest of town. 
He said the rains had been 
fine but did not damage 
the cotton o f which he 
expects to gather about 
ten bales.

i 077r.HF.Vlini.KT CAPRICE -  debuts as an all new, fnll-slze car 
closely tuned to changbig consumer life styles and matched with 
the nation’s goal of conserving fuel and natural resourses. The

completely redesigned Caprice will be offered In covqpe, sedan and 
station wagon models. Ushering In a new era of Chevrolets, the 
1977 Caprices boast more fuel effclency and safety effectiveness. 
See at Ken Braden Motors, Inc.

Cancer Society 
Meets Goal

The American Cancer 
Society met September 16 
at the San Angelo Savings 
and Loans Building with 
Mrs. Alvis Johnson, Cru­
sade Chairman, reporting 
that the goal was made for 
the 1976 crusade with 
$2,885 collected for the 
crusade and $1050 in 
memorials.

Mrs. Johnson also 
stated that 56 awards had 
been given for special 
achievements.

Dr. C.F. Browne, presi­
dent of the local organiza­
tion, presented the board 
with certificates of awards. 
Sutton County has won the 
Golden Achievement A- 
ward for 22 years...the 
only county in Texas that 
has that honor.

Special events chairman 
from Eldorado talked to 
the group about special 
events for this county.

Don Haley, field repre­
sentative o f San Angelo, 
reported that Sutton has 
had a very successful year 
and urged each one to 
work to help find more 
cures for cancer.

"Forget injuries, never forget 
kindnesses." Confucius

’77 Chevrolet Debuts as New Full Size American Car
The 1977 Chevrolet 

debuts as an all-new, 
full-size car for America, 
more closely tuned to 
changing consumer life ­
styles and matched with 
the nation’ s goals of 
conserving fuel and natur­
al resources.

The complete rede­
signed Caprice and Impala 
models offer crisp new 
styling with a long list of 
design and engineering

A FULL 
SERVICE 

BANK

■M N A T I  O N A L  B A N K
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P.O. BOX 798 SONORA,TEXAS 76950
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Money,
money,
money.

money,
money,
money-

If you need it, we have it . . .
If you hove it, we'd like to 

help you save it.
IT’S JUST THAT PLAIN AND SIMPLE

Leslie L. Robertson

Food Center 
Hires New 

Store Manager
Leslie L. Robertson, 

formerly o f Abilene, has 
been hired as manager of 
the local Food Center 
Store.

Robertson is a graduate 
of San Angelo Central 
High School and attended 
Angelo State University. 
Prior to moving to Sonora 
he was manager o f the 
K-Mart Food Store in 
Abilene for the past four 
years. He worked at 
K-Mart Store in San 
Angelo while attending 
ASU and then moved to 
the Lubbock and Houston 
stores where he was in the 
sporting goods depart­
ment. He served as 
assistant manager o f the 
San Angelo Store for one 

■ year before moving to 
Abilene.

Moving here with 
Robertson are his wife, 
Jan, and two children, 
Traesha Rene, 19 months 
old, and Tessa Leigh, 
seven months old.

A native of San Angelo, 
Robertson’ s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Louis Robertson, 
still reside there. Mrs. 
Robertson’ s parents are 
Mr. and Mrs. H .W . 
Ketchem of Ballinger.

Robertson began work 
at Food Center last week 
and will reside with his 
family at 704 Water 
Street.

Washing machines?
Here’s the dirt: they're in the 

Yellow Pages.
For a clean sweep of washing machines, 

any other appliances— 
or any product 

or service— 
rem ember...

They’ re there at 
your fingertips when 

your fingers do the 
walkingthroughthe 

Yellow Pages.
yellow pages

improvements. The new 
Chevrolets boast more fuel 
effciency and safety effec­
tiveness while being 11 
inches shorter and almost 
700 pounds lighter than 
their predecessors.

The new models have 
more room inside despite 
the smaller exterior size. 
This includes more rear 
legroom and more front 
and rear headroom along 
with added usable storage 
space in the trunk.

Matching the trim new 
dimensions, additional op­
erating efficiency and fuel 
economy is made possible 
by the addition o f a 4.1 
litre (250-cubic inch), 
six-cylinder engine and a 
smaller displacement 5 
litre (305-cubic inch) base 
V8.

The six-cylinder engine 
is the ■ standard power 
plant for sedans and 
coupes while the 5.7 litre 
(350-cubic inch) V8 b e ­
comes the top optional 
engine. All are used in 
conjunction with the auto­
matic Turbo Hydra-matic 
transmission.

Ride and handling char­
acteristics parallel the 
advances in weight reduc­
tion and interior accom ­
modations.

The 1977 Chevrolet is 
being offered in two series 
--the top of the line 
Caprice and the Impala. 
Two-door coupes, four- 
door sedans and four-door 
two- and three-seat station 
wagons are available in 
each series. The former 
Impala S and Landau 
options are discontinued.

The 1977 Chevrolet has 
a 116-inch wheelbase, a

Teen
Scene

Instead o f the regular 
news, I thought I would do 
something a bit different.
I would like to compliment 
our school system this 
year. So many changes 
have been made for its 
improvement that I think it 
is time to call attention to 
this.

I suppose the first place 
to start would be with the 
faculty. In order to have 
student cooperation their 
instructors must care 
which is only one of the 
quantités that our instruc­
tors have. It would be 
absolutely im possible to 
learn under favoritism and 
non-caring teachers.

We all (students and 
teachers alike) have more 
time for lunch. A seven 
period day was adopted 
making the load extremely 
lighter. New subjects are 
taught to break the 
monotony of the same old 
school routine. Among 
these are journalism, art, 
drafting, sociology and 
recreational P. E. The one 
year old programs such as 
HECE and DEÇA have 
improved considerably. I 
speculate that the greatest 
thing is that boredom  is 
not a problem . There is 
always something to do!

The students make or 
break the school. This 
year’ s students seem to be 
friendlier, have more pride 
and spirit. These factors 
are very important to the 
attitude of the body as a 
whole. New students have 
been made welcome and 
since they are a part of the 
body it is also important 
that they feel a part of the 
students and accept the 
new school along with 
spirit and pride.

Support all school activ- 
itites whether it be the 
yearbook, the book fair 
(Oct. 5,6,7), football, bas­
ketball or any club to 
which you belong. Involve­
ment is essential for a 
good attitude.!!

Heating water accounts for 
15 percent of the energy used in 
the home, so he sure to insulate 
your hot water storage tank 
and piping.

reduction o f 5.5 inches 
from the 1976 Chevrolet. 
Its overall length is 211.9 
inches (10.8 inches under 
the 1976 Chevrolet). How­
ever, its height o f 57.4 
inches is 2.3 inches 
greater than the former 
model. Its width is 75.4 
inches, a reduction of 
approximately four inches.

The new styling of the 
1977 Chevrolet features a 
forward thrust with a 
strong fender-high hori­
zontal line the full length

o f the car and a gently 
sloping aerodynamic hood. 
An exclusive coupe profile 
features a wraparound 
rear window. Caprice and 
Impala models have dis­
tinctive grille, ornamenta­
tion and trim features 
inside and out.

5 ^

FREE
$6 TO $8 

VALUE
ON JOHN ROBERTS 

CLASS RINGS

corner
with
Joe

Kiowski
R.Ph.

Bring in this ad and 
order your ring by 

November 15 
to get one of these 
custom features, 

FREE:
•  Initial in stone

or insert under stone

•  Fi reburst effect 
or suniite effect

•  Golden signature

•  White gold instead 
of yellow gold

SAunJU î

Downtown 387-2755

Color T.V.
A  Health Problem

A short time ago. 
Color T.V. sets were 
regarded as a public 
health problem because 
o f X-ray emissions. 
Viewers were warned to 
watch T.V. from a 
distance o f at least 6 
feet away.

Since then, steps 
taken by manufacturers 
resulted in a great 
margin o f safety, biit 
the risk factor is still 
there. The problem is 
in defective sets pro­
duced by companies 
with poor quality con­
trols on the assembly 
line.

The U.S. Consummer 
Safety Commission sug­
gests that when a set is 
suspected o f being 
faulty it should be 
checked by a technician 
qualified to measure 
radiation leakage. If 
you discover a defect, 
you can call the 
commission, toll-free at 
800-638-2666 to report 
it.

For prompt and de­
pendable prescription  
service, CALL: 387- 
3534 and speak to ns at 
BRONCO PHARMACY, 
116 N .W . Concho. W e  
retain family Rx records 
for Income Tax Data, 
Change of Doctor, Lost 
Prescription, and snp- 
piy em ergency after 
hoars service: CALL 
387-3569.

Franciscan's

Greatest

20% Off
on Every Rece!

HURRY! SALE ENDS SATURDAY, OCTOBER 2nd.

Tedford Jewelry
Downtown Sonora 387-2434
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