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Devil Rates 
To Increase

Due to drastic increases in 
printing, paper supplies, and 
postage, the D ev il’ s R iver 
News has been forced to raise 
subscription rates. This will be 
the first raise in newspaper 
prices in a number o f years.

New rates w ill become 
effective September 1 and will 

' be as follows: Sonora sub­
scribers, $5 per year; out o f 
county subscribers, $6.30 per 
year, including tax; and out of | 
state subscribers w ill be 
charged $6.85 including tax. 
No tax w ill be charged on 
Sonora subscriptions.

Those readers purchasing 
newspapers from newsstands 
will be asked to increase their | 
cost to 15c per copy. These 
papers are not taxable. 
Subscribers buying from the 
many newsboys that deliver 
papers on W ednesday a fter­
noons w ill be charged 16c, 
which includes tax.
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Sonoran's Father 
Dies May 28

Graveside services were held 
M ay 29 for Dr. Paul Harold 
Heiser, father o f  Mrs. Lin 
Hicks. Services for Dr. Heiser, 
71, were held at Fairmount 
Cem etery with Dr. Jerold 
M cBride, pastor o f First 
Baptist Church of San Angelo, 
officiating. He died May 28 at 
San Angelo’s Clinic Hospital.

) Dr. Heiser was an oral 
surgeon and had lived in San 
Angelo since 1947. He was a 
graduate o f  Baylor Dental 
School.

Other survivors include his 
w ife; one son, Paul Harold 
Heiser, Jr., o f Sacramento, 
California; one brother and two 
sisters. Also surviving him are 
two grandsons, Lindsey Paul 
Hicks and Clay Hicks.

Hooper and Brown 
Teams Continue 

.W inning Streak
Hooper Trucking and Brown 

E lectric continued their 
winning streaks by winning 
their games in last w eek ’ s 
play. Hooper played two games 
last week defeating the team 
from Dresser Atlas May 28 by 
a score of 11-10. On May 30 
they defeated Intratex 15-0. In 
that game Hooper team 
member Dodie Snyder hit a 
home run but only got to 
second base.

Brown E lectric played the 
team from Brittain Construc­
tion M ay 29, defeating that 
team 13-11.

Two games were played May 
26 with HNG losing to 
McCullough 20-2 and Amoco 
losing to Intratex 8-7. 
McCullough beat Amoco 9-10 
on May 27. Intratex lost to 
Dowell by a score o f 15-11.

May 28 the City o f Sonora 
defeated Tom Brown 15-5 and 
on May 29 the City lost their 
game to HNG by a score of 
12-11. Dresser defeated Amoco 
6-4 in the May 30 game. 
SCHEDULE FOR Jupe 5-12 

June 5 - City vs Brittain and 
Hooper vs Amoco 

, June 6 - HNG vs Dresser 
and Brown Electric vs City 

June 9 - Tom Brown vs 
Intratex, Dowell vs McCul­
lough

June 10 - Brown Electric vs 
Amoco, HNG vs Tom Brown 

June 11 - Dowell vs Brittain 
June 12 - Intratex vs City, 

Hooper vs Brittain

Eastern Star 
To InstaU Officers

Sonora Chapter #575 of the 
♦Order o f the Eastern Star, will 
hold their installation o f 
officers ceremony June 6 at 8 
p.m. The meeting is open and 
will begin at 8 p.m.

I

Sonora’s senior 4-H Wool and Mohair team set a new record when they placed first in the 
state May 17 in San Angelo. The team of Snsan Schwiening, Larry Finklea, Marsha Finklea 
and Mark Van Hoozer will compete in the National Wool Judging contest to he held in 
copjnnction with the 38th annual Sonora Wool and Mohair Show heginning June 10.

38th Wool, Mohair Show Upcoming
Officia ls expect to register 

scores o f producers and 
members o f 4-H clubs and FFA 
chapters competing in this 
year’ s Sonora W ool and 
Mohair Show.

Scheduled June 10-11-12, the 
38th show w ill be about 20 
years older than most of the 
4-H’ers and Future Farmers.

The three parts o f the show 
make it the largest o f its kind 
in the United States: the 
judging o f wool, mohair, 
sheep, goats and rangeland by 
Texas 4-H and FFA youths; the 
open show for any U. S. 

producer to exhibit his wool or 
mohair fleeces, or both; and 
the National 4-H Wool Judging 
Contest.

Out-of-town teams from 
Niobrara County, W yom ing, 
Pueblo County, Colorado, and 
Dona Ana County, New Mexico 
will be arriving in Sonora to 
judge in the national wool 
judging contest. Other teams 

are expected from  San Saba 
County, Tarrant County, 
McCulloch County, and Kerr 
County. Sutton County 4-H 
team will also compete.

Show Committee Chairman 
Fred Campbell said that for the 
38th year the Sonora Lions 
Club would sponsor the show, 
in cooperation with the Sonora 
W ool and Mohair Company 
and the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service. The Lions 
also sponsor the awards 
luncheon that climaxes the 
annual event.

Awards w ill be presented 
June 12 in the Sutton County 
4-H Center. Besides the Lions, 
other sponsors o f awards are 
the Sonora Wool and Mohair 
Company, the Branding Iron 
Smoke House o f Sonora, the 
Federal Land Bank Association 
o f Sonora, the D ev il’ s R iver 
M otel and the Twin Oaks 
Motel o f Sonora, the Edwards 
Plateau Soil Conservation 
District, the Jan-Co Ranch 
Company o f Fort M cKavett 
and Nathan’s Jewelers o f San 
Angelo.

O fficia ls w ill also present 
three special awards: the Joe 
Berger Memorial Trophy to the 
premier junior wool exhibitor, 
the Fred T. Earwood Memorial 
Trophy to the prem ier junior 
mohair exhibitor, and the E. B.

W ool And Mohair Show Committee
PROGRAM CHAIRM AN -

James Alexander 
GENERAL SUPERINTEN­

DENT - James A. Gray 
S U P E R IN T E N D E N T S  - 
MOHAIR JUDGING, Armer 

Earwood
WOOL JUDGING, Norm 

Rousselot
WOOL BAG JUDGING, W. 

B. McMillan
JUDGING CONTEST, Jack 

Groff, James Bassett, George 
Ahlschwede, and Bob Ragsdale 

ASSISTAl^S - Tom Wood­
ward, V irg il Polocek, Leroy 
Hoermann, Bob Steger, Rich­
ard Bjerregaard, and Joe Bill 
Averitt

WEIGHING COMMITTEE -
Arm er Earwood, Mrs. Fred 
Earwood, J. D. Cook, John 
David Cook, A llen  Belk, and 
Herbert Jones

RECORD CLERKS - Mrs. 
Fred Earwood, Chairman; A. 
E. Prügel, W alter Pope, 
Herbert Jones, Vestel Askew, 
Butch Taylor, James Hunt, and 
Allen Belk

PUBLICITY - Doyle Morgan 
and Don Bynum 

RIBBON CLERKS - Don 
Spiller, Eddie Smith, A lbert 
Ward, and Robert Langford 

TABULATING - Robert Ken- 
smg. Chairman; Phil Johnson, 
A llen Turner, and Glen D. 
Fisher

GRADING COMMITTEE -
Virgil Polocek, Chairman; Bill 
Doran, Calvin Van Hoozer, 
Turney Friess, Patsy Schwien­
ing, C leve T. Jones, C laire

Powers, Lawrence Finklea, 
Corky Schwiening, Pascal Alli­
son, Carolyn Doran, Dorothy 
Pope, Rex Ann Friess, John 
M itte l, Lola Beth Jones, 
Mickey Powers, Jodie Finklea, 
Preston 0 . Love, W ade 
Richardson, W ill W allace, 
W esley Richardson, M ike 
Stewart, Martha Elliott, Larry 
Finklea, Bill Finklea, Susan 
Schwiening, John David Cook, 
Marsha Finklea, Mark Hemp­
hill, Trudy Draper, Mary Sue 
Galindo, M ike Street, Laura 
Gibbs, Cathy W ard, and 
Debbie Howard

GROUP LEADERS - Gene 
W allace, Chairman, Glen 
Richardson, B ill Saveli, Tom 
Glasscock, Jerry D. Balch, 
Hensel Mathews, Bill Karnes, 
Tommy Love, Lin Hicks, 
G eorge W allace, B ill T ittle , 
Jim Kimbrel, Bob Caruthers, 
R. W. Wallace, Robert Allison, 
and Preston Love 

RECREATION COMMITTEE 
M r. and Mrs. J. C. Surber, 
Chairmen; Mr. and Mrs. Nolan 
Gibbs, Mr. and M rs. Robert 
Zapata, Mr. and Mrs. Law­
rence Finklea, M r. and Mrs. 
Turney Friess, Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Van Hoozer, Mr. and 
Mrs. Corky Schwiening, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pedro Galindo, Jr., 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bill Stewart 

OVER ALL SHOW  COM ­
MITTEE - Fred Campbell, 
Chairman; Arm er Earwood, 
Norm Rousselot, James Hunt, 
and Vestel Askew

Keng Memorial Trophy to the 
junior team scoring most points 
in range judging.

On June 11 the 4-H and FFA 
youths will judge wool, mohair, 
sheep, goats and range, and 
the junior and adult entries of 
wool and mohair fleeces in the 
Open Division will be judged. 
All begins at 8:00 a.m.

On June 12 Superintendents

Jack L. Groff and Dr. George 
A . Ahlschwede o f the Ex­
tension Service w ill start the 
National 4-H W ool Judging 
Contest at 8:00 a.m.

Other members o f the 
Campbell committee are Nor­
man Rousselot, Arm er Ear- 
wood, James Hunt and Vestel 
Askew.

Sutton County Extension 
Agent D. C. Langford said 
more information about the 
show could be had by 
telephoning 915/387-3101 or 
387-2543, or by writing P. 0. 
Box 137, Sonora, Texas 76950.

SHELLY BROOKS 
RECEIVES M A DEGREE 

Mrs. Shelly M . Brooks 
received her master o f  arts 
degree in mathematics from 
Baylor University during cere­
monies held May 16. Approxi­
mately 1,000 senior students 

re involved in the gradua­
tions exercises held in the 
Heart O ’ Texas Coliseum. Mrs. 
Brooks is the daughter o f Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Morriss.

nfiorm ooooooi

Pidice Reports
City Police Department 

offic ia ls were kept busy over 
the weekend working tra ffic  
accidents. No injuries were 
reported in any o f the 
accidents.

An accident at the intersec­
tion o f Chestnut and Tayloe 
Streets occured at 12:40 p.m., 
Friday afternoon. The vehicles 
were driven by Eduardo 
Noriega and Leon Lee 
Williams.

On Saturday Enedina Mata 
o f Sonora and Emanuel 
Jackson o f Los Angeles, 
California, were drivers o f two 
autos that collided at U.S. 277 
North and the IH 10 Service 
Road.

On Sunday morning at 1:15 
a.m., a hit and run accident 
was investigated by Jerry 

Kem p. Ector M iguel Cas- 
tilleja was the driver o f a car 
hit by another auto that left the 
scene o f the accident. The 
driver o f  the hit and run 
vehicle was later apprehended 
in Eldorado and charged with 
failure to y ield  right o f  way 
and leaving the scene o f an 
accident.

Davis Construction Company 
Gets Water Loop Contract

The City o f Sonora entered 
into a contract with Birl Davis, 
Incorporated when city aider- 
men met at the city hall 
Monday. The contract is for 
construction o f the South 
W ater Loop that w ill supply 
water for a city water well 
located near the local hospital. 
This additional water service 
was proposed to alleviate the 
city’s water problem during the 
summer months when usage is 
at a maximum.

D avis ’ low bid was 
$20,990.90, as opposed to the

Clly Police 
W ill Make 
Vacalion Pairob

Sonora residents who are 
planning to take vacations 
during the summer months 
may call the office o f the City 
Police before leaving town, and 
city patrolmen will check your 
residence during both day and 
night patrols.

Chief o f Police Bill Webster 
says persons should call his 
office  leaving their name, 
address, when they are leaving 
and when they expect to 
return, and also the name o f a 
person or persons who may 
have a key to the residence 
should the need arise to enter.

The W eaiher
COMPILED by PAT BROWN

Rain Hi L<
May 27 .15 85 61
May 28 87 61
May 29 1.14 88 5(
May 30 .18 87 5«
May 31 88 4',
June 1 86 5'
June 2 86 5̂

Rainfall for the month .00 
Rainfall for the year, 8.28.

highest bid from H. B. Zachry 
Company in the amount o f 
$52,325.02. Six other bids were 
received.

The water loop extends from 
the Tommy Thorp hill to 
Highway 277 South. Construc­
tion should be complete in 90 
days.

City aldermen and County 
commissioners agreed on a 
joint purchase of a rural fire

PAUL LAW GRADUATES
The sixth commencement 

exercise was held by the 
University o f Texas School of 
Medicine at San Antonio, May 
3. Am ong those graduating 
was Paul Foster Law o f 
Georgetown. He is married to 
the form er Nancy N eill. Mr. 
Law has a B. S. from Texas 
A & M , M . S. from  Southern 
M ethodist, B. S., PhD. from 
the University o f  Texas at 
Austin, and served his anes­
thesio logy residency at the 
Bexar County Hospital in San 
Antonio.

truck. The truck is o f military 
design and is complete with a 
750 gallon capacity water tank. 
Cost o f the truck is $3,500, to 
be divided equally between the 
county and city.

City aldermen also entered 
into a contract with Carter 
Johnson o f Rauscher P ierce 
Securities Corporation, to do a 
feas ib ility  study o f financing 
water and sewer improvements 
in the city. This study consists 
o f the probable recommenda­
tion o f $280,000 in water 
improvement revenue bonds 
and sewer general obligation 
bonds in the amount o f 
$85,000.

Joe David Ross, representing 
the Sonora Park Association, 
met with the council concern­
ing the public park proposal at 
the race track area. Plans for 
the park include tennis courts, 
rodeo arena, softball diamonds 
and picnic area. The council 
voted to be the sponsoring 
group for application o f the 
project.
OTHER CITY BUSINESS

Five Judging Teams Parlicipale 
In Kerrville Judging Conlesh M ay 31

Peeples Receives 
Prebaied Sentence

Stanley W ayne Peeples, 
charged with forgery  in the 
passing o f four $185 money 
orders cashed in K errv ille , 
Ozona and Sonora during the 
month o f M ay, was found 
guilty in Sutton County District 
Court M onday morning. 
Peeples received a fiv e  year 
probated sentence after agree­
ing to make restitution on the 
stolen goods.

Peeples and two companions 
also involved in the incident, 
were apprehended in San 
An gelo  after passing the 
money orders, stolen in San 
Antonio last year during a 
robbery.

District Judge Charles Sher­
rill, county and district judge, 
presided.

^ark Association 
M eoh Tonight

A meeting o f all Sonora Park 
and Rodeo Association stock 
holders w ill be held tonight 
(Thursday) at the Powers 
Livestock Pens at 7:30 p.m.

Details and discussion o f the 
necessary procedures to 
consider in transferring the 
park association land to a city- 
county community park is the 
main item on the agenda. 
Prelim inary plans to locate 
different activities on the land 
have been plotted by Dewey 
Shroyer, engaged by the Park 
Association.

Plans will also be discussed 
for the junior rodeo to be held 
in July.

F ive Sutton County 4-H 
judging teams participated in 
the K errv ille  wool, mohair 
range and grass judging 
contests Saturday, M ay 31 
The contests were designed to 
provide training for youth who 
plan to participate in the 
Sonora Wool and Mohair Show 
on June 10, 11, and 12.

The Sutton County senior 
4-H team composed o f Susan 
Schwiening, Larry Finklea 
Marsha Finklea and Mark Van 
Hoozer placed first in range 
judging, first in mohair 
judging, first in wool judging 
and first in the overall wool 
and mohair judging contest. 
Susan Schwiening placed first 
in senior range judging, with 
Larry Finklea placing third, 
and Marsha Finklea placing 
fourth. Larry placed second in 
wool judging, second in mohair 
judging, and first in overall 
wool and mohair judging. 
Susan placed first in mohair 
judging and second in the 
overall wool and mohair 
judging. Marsha placed third 
in wool judging, third in 
mohair judging and third in the 
overall wool and mohair 
contest. The team score in 
wool and mohair judging was 
2087 points which was 6 points 
higher than the team posted in 
the state 4-H wool and mohair 
contest in San Angelo.

The Sutton County 4-H 
“ R ed”  junior range team 
composed o f Paula Friess, 
Brad Johnson, Julie Stewart 
and Tommy Van Hoozer placed 
first in junior range judging 
and the “ White”  junior range 
team composed o f Sabrina 
Allison, Lee Burch and Marla 
Van Hoozer, placed second. 
H igh individuals were Paula 
Friess, first; Tammy Van 
Hoozer, second; Marla Van 
Hoozer, third; and Lee Burch, 
fourth.

The “ Red”  junior wool and 
mohair team composed o f 
Paula Friess, Preston Love, 
Lance Love and Brad Johnson 
won first in wool judging; 
second in mohair judging, and 
second in overall wool and 
mohair judging. Lance Love 
placed first in wopl judging 
and first in overall wool and 
mohair judging. Paula Friess 
placed second in wool judging, 
fourth in mohair judging and 
second in overall wool and 
mohair judging.

The Sutton County 4-H 
W h ite ”  wool and mohair 

judging team composed o f

Bretit Johnson, Qay Friess and 
Julie Stewart, also participated 
in the judging contest.

M r. and Mrs. Calvin Van 
Hoozer and Mr. and Mrs. 
Corky Schwiening supervised 
4-H members at the judging 
contest.

The Sutton County senior 
4-H grass judging team 
composed o f Mark Van Hoozer, 
Susan Schwiening and Marsha 
Finklea w ill compete in the 
state 4-H grass judging contest 
during the annual State 4-H 
Round-Up at Texas A & M  
University June 4. County 
Agent and Mrs. Clint Langford 
will supervise 4-H members at 
the State 4-H Round-Up.

In other business o f  the 
council it was agreed to lease a 
copy machine for use in the 
city hall from Xerox Company 
at $65 per month. The Leroy 
Whitworth property, James 
Alexander property and the 
property where the doctor’ s 
clinic is being erected was 
annexed into the city limits. It 
was also agreed that the roof 
on the City Hall building will 
be replaced.
SALES TAX

Taxes in the amount o f 
$5,013.99 were collected and 
reported for the month o f 
April.

Calgary W itte r, 
John M urrell, 
W b n  2 Awards

John M urrell o f Calgary, 
A lberta, Canada, actor and 
director, has received two 
distinguished awards for his 
playwriting ability.

M u rre ll’ s three-act play, 
“ Power In The B lood” , 
brought him the University of 
A lberta ’ s C liford  E. Lee 
Award, which not only involves 
a $1,500 prize, but guarantees 
a full-scale production next 
season by the U n iversity ’ s 
drama department.

“ Power In The Blood”  fan 
for a four night stand in the 
Pleiades Theatre in Calgary. 
The play deals with the issues 
of religion and loneliness of the 
main character. Charity Shep­
herd.

The playwright has also been 
notified that he has won a $500 
award in the University o f 
R egina ’ s 1975 playwriting 
competition. His winning entry 
was “ Memoir” , a work dealing 
with the later years of actress 
Sarah Bernhardt.

M urrell is m arried to the 
form er Cindy Galbreath, 
daughter o f Mrs. M argaret 
Galbreath and Billie Galbreath.

4.1 f l -

Miss Gloria Gomez, daughter of Mr. and Mrs, Pete Gomez, 
was crowned qneen of the St. Ann’s Spring Festival In 
ceremonies held Saturday. Miss Gomez’ float in the Saturday 
parade was awarded second place.
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BALLINGER SETS 
BICENTENNIAL FAIR

“ Street Fair Americana”  is 
the name o f the two day 
bicentennial fair scheduled in 
Ballinger June 21 and 22. The 
fa ir w ill be held on the 
courthouse lawn in downtown 
Ballinger where exhibitors may 
set up booths for antiques, 
arts, crafts, collectables, ven­
dors, food, handicraft, weaving 
and handiwork o f all kinds. For 
reservations contact Buddy 
McQueen, 915-365-3262 in 
Ballinger.
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Texaco-Toons
By —  JAMES

“ Watch that 
it slips."

hood

We always watch 
for your safety!

out

Blackman's
Texaco

'Best Service In Sonora"

801 N. Crockett 
Phone 387-2422

from  HISTORY'S SC RAPB OOK
D A T E S  AN D E V E N T S  FRO M  Y E S T E R Y E A R S

June 10, 1965
M ayor A . E. Prügel was 

authorized to request a city 
wide clean-up campaign, effec­
tive immediately, at a meeting 
of the City Commissioners.

Miss Mickey Hardegree won 
a third place in statewide 
competition in the flute 
division o f the Interscholastic 
League for Musicians at the 
University o f Texas.

The Sutton County grass 
judging team, composed o f 
Chris Berger, Bill Green, Mark 
Jacoby and Chris Frizzell, won 
first place at the State 4-H 
Grass Judging contest held at 
Texas A& M  University.

John Bell and L. E. Holland 
were winners o f the champion­
ship flight of the Partnership 
Tourney held here. They 
out-shot 19 other teams.

June 10, 1955
M r. and Mrs. Getfrge H. 

Neill and Mr. and M rs .. Gay 
Copeland returned from  a 
fishing trip to Guaymas,. 
Mexico.

Among those honored at the 
Lions Club meeting was J. D. 
Lowrey, a charter member of 
the organization.

Miss Jo Ann Smith o f Big 
Spring became the bride o f 
John Franklin Howell, Jr., in 
ceremonies at the First 
Christian Church in Big 
Spring.

Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Vandiver 
became parents o f  a son, 
Robert Garr.

George E. Smith, Lions Club 
president, left for Atlantic City, 
New Jersey, where he will 
attend the annual convention of 
Lions International.

June 15, 1945
Eighteen members o f  the 

Sonora School faculty have

B IR l V . D A V IS  C O M P A N Y M C .

UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS

Diesel, Gasoline & Butane

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

Dirt Construction & Roustabouts
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center of the Edwards Plateau in West Texas.
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Roy Taiamantes, Printing Department
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News and Advertising Deadline — Tuesday, 12 noon 
D ISPLAY  ADVERTISING - Open rate - $1.25 per column inch 

Volume and Frequency Rates Available upon Application 
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Classified Display — $2.00 p w  column inch 

Classified ads and legal notices of m w e than 100 words will 
be charged at the rate of 104 per word (or 504 per Opt. 
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be charged for at the regular advertising rates.
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M E M B E R (9 7 5  ASSOCIATION

signed contracts to teach 
another school year in Sonora. 
Eight are not returning or have 
not yet signed contracts.

Federal car stamps, now on 
sale at the local post o ffice, 
must be on all cars by July 1, 
according to an announcement 
made by Postmaster Dewitt 
Lancaster. The stamps cost $5.

Confirmation o f the death of 
her husband. Private First 
Class Pablo A. Soto on Luzon 
Island, has been recived by 
Antonia Soto o f Sonora.

Lt. Young B. Newson, who 
has recently returned from 
a prisoner o f  war camp in 
Germany, is v is iting  his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Carson 
West.

63 Yean Ago
Mrs. A . H. Nathan and 

baby, accompanied by Mrs. I. 
Ellis, Jr., went to Menard for a 
few days visit.

W . A. Miers, who has made 
a success of stockraising and 
has stayed with the Stockman’ s 
Paradise all the tim e, was 
in the Metropolis this week.

Curt Allison left for Meridian 
Friday to see his boy.

Mrs. J. C. McDonald is in 
Galveston for the benefit o f her 
health.

Bert Page, the prominent 
young rancher o f Mayer, was 
in Sonora last week.

State Representative Susan McBee and Senator Pete Snelson look on as Governor Dolph 
Briscoe signs Into law a bill Introduced In the House by Mrs. McBee and sponsored In the 
Senate by Snelson. The law provides that In sparsely populated counties the Commissioners 
Courts may establish voting precincts of less than 100 voters. The Law becomes effective 90 
days after being signed by the Governor.

Strawberries, in season now, 
are a good source o f Vitamin C 
needed daily. W hole straw­
berries dipped in confectioner’s 
sugar, sliced as ice cream or 
cereal toppers or with milk 
make nutritious and tasty 
snacks, or m ini-meals, Sally 
Springer, foods and nutrition 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, 
The Texas A & M  University 
System, says.

THE DEVIL’ S RIVER PHILOSOPHER SEZ.......................

He Sees No Heed To Protect People 
From  Oiiltandish T V  Commercials

Editor’s note; The Devil’s 
River Philosopher on his 
bitterweed ranch on the Dry 
Devil’s River looks at TV 
commercials this week, or 
something.

Dear editor:
That governm ent that gov ­

erns least is not necessarily the 
best, any more than the one 
that governs the most is. 
Somewhere in between there 
ought to be some sort o f  a 
happy medium, but it doesn’t 
look like it’ s being struck.
_ For instance, the govern ­
mental agency that regulates 
television has come out with a 
ruling that’s going to throw a 
monkey wrench in TV  com­
mercials. I f  two women are 
comparing detergents, it says, 
and pretending to be next-door 
neighbors but in rea lity  are 
actors, then the commercial 
has got to say so. I f a man 
claims his wife whom he loves 
very much eats right, exercises 
and takes two of those tablets 
every day to make sure 
the patent medicine company 
makes money, then, I suppose, 
she really has to take two of 
the things every day, plus 
exercising and eating right. 
And i f  her husband stops 
loving her I suppose she’s got 
to get one that does or drop 
the commercial.

I don ’ t understand such 
rulings. I f  women can be taken 
in by two hired actors praising 
soap, th ere ’ s not a govern ­
mental agency in the universe 
smart enough to devise a law 
to protect them. If they start 
taking two tablets a day 
because some bright-eyed 
actress claims she does, let 
em.

I f  you ’ re going to have 
complete honesty on television, 
the next step of course would 
be to require Marshal Dillon to 
use live bullets. And when a 
villa in  swerves his car o f f  a

mountain road and over a cliff, 
he’s got to be in it. Be a good 
way to stop some o f the shows.

I ’ll tell you, when you start 
requiring actors who brag on 
buses to ride them, actors who 
tout patent m edicine to take 
the stuff, actors who smack 
their lips over corn flakes to 
eat the things, you’re going to 
wreck te levision , not to 
mention having a lot o f  sick 
actors.

M aybe the people in the 
Washington- bureaus are taken 
in by such commercials and 
need protecting, but people 
around here mostly just mutter 
and guffaw.

You reckon we need a law 
prohibiting law-makers from 
making any more laws for a 
while?

Yours faithfully,

c o m m u n i t y "
C A LEN D A R

Friday, June 6
3-5 p .m ., Sonora W om an’ s 

Club Library open
Simday, June 8

Services at the church o f 
your choice

Monday, June 9
9 a.m.. County Commission­

ers meeting in County Judge’ s 
office in Courthouse

'Taesday, June 10
Sonora W ool and Mohair 

Show
12 noon. Downtown Lions 

Club luncheon in fellowship 
hall o f First Methodist Church

3-5 p.m ., M iers Home 
Museum open

7:30 p.m .. F irem en ’ s A ux­
iliary meeting

7:30 p.m.. West Side Lion’s 
Club m eeting at Commercial 
Cafe

7:30 p.m ., Jaycee-ettes 
meeting at Commercial Cafe 

Wednesday, Jane 11
3-5 p.m ., Sonora W om an’ s 

Club Library open

FO R  SALE
3 Bedroom, 2 

Good Location ■ 
Nice Yard -

Bath Home 
Near School 

Ready For
Immediate Occupancy

3 Bedroom, 2 Bath Home 
1600 Sq. Ft. - Large Lot 

With 260 Feet Fronting On Poplar St.

See or Call
DOYLE MORGAN, BROKER 

at
Morgan & Hunt Insurance

210 E. Main 
387-2676

C o m ervaflon____ Key To The Fufure
Will Wallace’s conservation 

essay was submitted for 
national judging recently. Will 
was first place senior winner in 
local competition.

By Will Wallace 
This is the only world we 

have to live in. I f there is no 
world there can be no future. 
We must conserve our natural 
resources. Our soil is so 
precious to us. It nourishes our 
human bodies with the food we 
get from it. I f  we waste our 
soil we will not have good food 
for i f  the soil is depleted of 
minerals, we also are depleted

Our News Letter
By Bob Krueger

W hile trave lling in the 
district last weekend, I was 
struck by two repeated 
refrains. One was the strong 

.support and respect for the 
President’ s decisive action in 
recovering our sailors. I 
cpmmend the President for 
that action. The second was 
the echo o f what I have been 
hearing for a long tim e: the 
desire o f the American people 
for strong leadership.

The task o f providing 
sustained national leadership is 
not demonstrated in a single 
action, but is a long-term  
undertaking. The national 
leaders we have most respect­
ed, in our nation and other 
nations—people like Lincoln, 
Washington, Churchill-have 
asked their fellow countrymen 
not to give less, but to give 
more than they would normally 
g ive  to their nation. Leaders 
must speak from  a strong 
sense o f their own inner 
spiritual resources, and they 
must tap that w ell o f  inner 
spiritual strength that allows 
them to hold firm ly to basic 
principles when confusing 
events would tend to distract 
others. Leaders, in our nation 
and in other nations, who have 
succeeded have done so 
because they responded to an 
awareness o f  their inner 
potential, and the potential of 
all mankind. M oreover, be­
cause they recognize an inner 
bond among all mankind, they 
are able to call out our best 
hopes and our finest action.

The reservoir of goodness is 
waiting in the American 
people. If, instead o f asking 
our people to consume more, 
our leaders at the national, 
state, and local levels will help 
people to discover what they 
can o ffe r  their nation, our 
country w ill be propelled  in 
new and positive directions as 
we look toward our bicenten­
nial year. That would be to our 
shared advantage.

ooooooaoocooooooc

Save 50%
By Using Your 
Present Cotton

IN A COMPLETELY  
REBUILT MATTRESS

W estern 
Mattress Co.
Son Angelo, Texas 

387-2222

of minerals. W e can do things 
to keep our soil better. Such as 
crop rotation, fertilizers, pesti­
cides, and wind breaks to 
prevent erosion. Without the 
soil the human race would 
starve to death.

The water we drink is vital 
to our future. It keeps our 
vegetation alive for us to eat as 
well as for other animals to 
eat. Water keeps us alive. If 
we don’t conserve this precious 
liquid the entire world would 
be in a bind with no future.

Trees and plants do much 
more than just sit in the 
ground. Plants provide the 
people and animals with food. 
They also hold down our 
precious topsoil. Trees provide 
us with our homes, furniture," 
pencils, even this paper I ’m 
w riting on and much, much 
more.

The air we breathe is just as 
important as the trees, plants, 
water and soil. W e must 
breathe this air to live. The 
plants must have this to 
survive.

So, as you see, it’ s just one 
bi^ chain. I f  we waste our 
precious resources we are in. 
bad shape. I f one'living thing 
is deprived o f a resource we all 
must suffer the consequences 
so, we must conserve this 
place of ours or there will be 
no future.

Cecil Westerman
Would
Like
TO
Be
YOUR
Pharmacist

i
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A n d

Siap^y. Íñvítíiday,
Thursday, Jane 5

Janice Dunn 
Rex Merriman 
Mrs. Herman Smith 
Terri Ann Castro 
Linda Behrens

Friday, Jane 6
Ree Dine Hill 
Louis Powers

Saturday, June 7 
Bert Bloodworth 
Kathy Morgan Spain 
John Bautista 
Mrs. William Phinizy

Sunday, June 8
Frank Lloyd Wright 
Corbie DuBose 
Hilton Luckie 
Carl Joe Vargas

Monday, Jane 9
Darcy Carroll 
Melissa Nance 
Charles Hopf 
John Paul Bautista 
Jessie Gutierrez

Taesday, Jane 10
Mrs. J. C. Stephen 
Mrs. Jim Caldwell 
Donny Letsinger 
Ted Turner

Curtis Mooney
Wednesday, Jane 11

Manuel Parades 
R. A. Halbert 
Mrs. Jack Trainer 
Leslie Ann Webster 
Lori Jan Webster 
Mrs. Stanley Mayfield 
Steve Dansby

A Land Bank 
loan at work
Once you ’ve decided to 
make major improvements 
on rural property, ask your 
local Land Bank Association 
about long-term financing. 
Finding a better way to 
borrow is as important as 
finding a better way to farm.

Long-term 
IMPROVEMENT 
LOANS at 
reasonable cost.

Federal Land Bank oF 
Sonora

A .E . Prügel, Mgr. 
387-2777

t o  tV »e

BUSINESS
AND

PROFESSIONAL
DIREaORY
HOUSE PAINTING  

Commercial Residential 
Ranch

FREE ESTIMATES 
Felipe “ Tito”  Vargas 

Call 387-3205

Mario Duran 
Water Well Drilling 

and Clean Outs 
Phone 387-2752

SONORA

BUY THIS SPACE 
$1.00 Week 

Devil’ s River News 
Phone 387-2222

M ELVIN  GLASSCOCK 

SHELL STATION 

Phone 387-2669 

West U.S. 290 Sonora

B & G  FEED

Livestock Hauling 

George Schwiening 

Call 387-2063

San-Tex Feed & Mineral Salt

CUSTOM 
Carpet Draperies 

FREE  ESTIMATES 
BROWN FURNITURE CO. 

Ozona, 392-2341

. „ H  & H FEED 
AND

^TOUCHING COMPANY 
Call 387-2806 

Purina & Godbold Feeds

ENED INA ’S 
H AIR  FASHIONS 
330 SW Gonzales 
Phone 387-3342 

Open Tuesday—Saturday

Pumbing and Heating 
Sewer - Rooter Machine 

Back Hoe D igging Equipment 
Sewer Line & Septic Tank 

Installations and Cleaning 
FR AN K  ADKINS Sonora

D f tS  HOT SHOT

24 Hour S erv ice  

887-3405 and 387-3427

Visiting San Angelo? Plan to stay 
at the newest and friendliest 
motor inn in town, LA QUINTA.
•  Over 100 beautiful guest rooms
•  Excellent dining in the Kachina 

Oining Room
•  The Kachina C lub -a  private 

club with dancing and 
entertainment nightly

•  Banquet and Meeting rooms 
to serve from 35 to 400 people

•  Coffee House
•  Surprisingly low rates
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FOODWAY 1 Del Monte Saving Spree
M a r k e t s

C ream  style

Corn
1 4

Specials Good Wod. Juno 4 thru Sal. June 7, 1975
Rights Reserved to Limit Quantities - He Sales te Dealers

pomato Sauce

6 . .  $ 1
Cans

)

Round Steak

nnnnnniaaaoaaiMMMM.«...» .̂-- ■ ■ ■ rrrnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnoiiiouotioqoot

19 . ̂ RumpRoast
.................................................................................................. ..

1 Lb. Pkg,

DANKWORTH

iBeoeooooeeoBBeooooeeooeocceooooooc
Bacon

2 9
a o y o o e c e o e o ^

: e s  ' '
aeeeeeeeeeeeec

Peak

Boneless

Cristo
Oil

Evefydoy Low Price

Coffee
^Frozen Foods «>

Kold Kountry

Papperenl - Sausage - 

Cheese - Hamburger

Pizzas
*2

Nou)
Kold Kountry

Hash Brown Potatoes i: 
Blackeyo Peas 10-oz. 

Brussel Sprouts lo-..

Mix or Match

For

WE'LL GLADLY
r e d e e m  y o u r  

USDA
FOOD STAMPS

Pineapple
luice

1

C h ^ p e d  o r  L e a f  F r u it

Spinach Cocktail

13=1
-NO TIC E-

WE W ILL BE RE-M ODELING - STARTING 
MONDAY 6 - 2 - 75 —  PLEASE EXCUSE THE 
INCONVENIENCE - WE W ILL TRY TO CARRY 
ON AS USUAL —

THANKS
HERSHEL & CREW.

Kountry Fresh

T o r tilla  Chips

49*

¡Green Beans
1

Del Mente M ixed

V e g e t a b l e s  3

S a u e r k r a u t  4  i r ’ l
Del Monte Mandarin

O r a n g e s  3  1

Kountry Fresh Produce c

Lettuce

84-ox.
Box

You Pay

Detergent

Cheer
$ | 7 6

Low Suds Dash

Detergent
$ 1 0 9

CaUf. SoUd Heads

Everyday Low Price
^  Kountry Fresh

▼ Red P lu m  J a m r lr  # 9 ^

▼ C ho w -C ho w ......... ..'jot5 9 ^
0  Kimbell Ice Cream

^  S a lt I Í  2 9 ‘
0  Freokies Pre-Sweetened b

V  Cereal ’.s / l '
^  Hershey's Chocolate _

V  S y ru p  4 9 '
^  Nabisco

V  O re o  Cookies. ykT O # ^

^  Ste a k Sauce....... .’ °bT  9 7 '
^  Hawaiian

V  Pun ch !'co°n 5 o
Post "10" 0  0 ^

y  C e re a l.......................V°kr0 8 ^

____ f Lb
Limes Calif. Jnlcy Lb. 29c
Corn Florida Golden Bantam Ears 6 for 79c
Cantaloupe r... Lb. 15c

Peaches
c

Lb

Fredericksburg

Dairy Products
GANDY’S A ist. Flavors

Yogurt 4
Kountry Fresh

Orange Danish Rolls..’.can

Kountry Fresh

Texas Style Biscuits...'.can
Chiffon (2 - 8-oz. Tubs) _  ^

Margarine....................ô ' O l
JUNE-DAIRY MONTH MEANS KOUNTRY FRESH CHEESE MONTH
Kountry Fresh
American or Pimiento

Sliced Cheese ic 59 '
Kountry Fresh Chunk a  m  Kountry Fresh _

Swiss Cheese.............. ’p̂g!' 1 Monterrey Jack.........!p°kg.̂  95 *
Kountry Fresh Halfmoon _  Kountry Fresh O  ■  1  C

Longhorn Cheese.......'pk̂  95 * Sharp Cheese............... ’.s^ 1̂
Kountry Fresh Wedge Cheddar

Rot Trap Cheese.
Kountry Fresh

Gouda.............. Pkg" 9 3 *

Apricot • Avocodo 
Apple - Strovvberry

Shampoo
„  $ 1 0 9  

■

#  Family Needs
AAennen

S k in  B ra c e r. . . .  $ 1 1 »
...................Btl. ■

Old Spice

M u s k  C o lo g n e ........
Ekco Miracle Roil

C a n  O p e n e r  "° !®’ eoch 4 9 ^
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Fire Auxiliary 
Honors Member 
With Shower

Mrs. James Blackman was 
honored with a baby shower at 
the M ay 13 m eeting o f  the 
firemen’s auxiliary. Mrs. Louis 
Olenick was hostess. Members 
held a business m eeting and 
played 42.

Winning 84 at 42 play was 
Mrs. Carl Teaff. Mrs. Bill Jolly 
was low and Mrs. Ervin 
W illman was high. Guests 
were Mrs. Bessie Thompson 
and Mrs. Ann Boyd.

Other members present were 
Mmes. Sammy Odom, Ronnie 
Crawford, Vernon Humphries, 
Mike Sipes and Joe Renfroe.

On M ay 27 fire  auxiliary 
members held their second 
m eeting o f  the month with 
Mrs. Sammy Odom hosting.

Those present played 42. 
Mrs. Kyle Donaldson won high 
score with Mrs. Frank Adkins 
winning the 84 prize. Mrs. 
Renfroe was low.

Others attending were Mrs. 
J. B. W right, guest; Mrs. 
Jolly, Mrs. Mollie Hite, Mrs. 
Humphries, and M rs. Craw­
ford.

Hospital
News

Patients receiving treatment 
at Lillian M . Hudspeth 
Memorial Hospital during the 
period from Tuesday, May 27 
thru Monday, June 2 Include 
the following:

John August*
Elaine Sanders*
Arselia Carrasco*
Baby Girl Carrasco*
Essa Hoover 
Valentine Favela 
Don Deel 
Katie Pearl 
Pauline Salinas*
Lee Haney 
Sendie Mason

*Patients dismissed during 
the same period.

The number o f  births is 
headed up again. The main 
reason is that the number of 
women o f child bearing age is 
the highest ever--yet women 
are having fewer children than 
before, reports Dorothy Taylor, 
family life education specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, The Texas 
A&M  University System.

S O N O R A  YO U TH  CENTER
Pool - Snooker - Pin Ball 

Air Hockey - - Deutscher Ball

Good Clean Family Entertainment 
GAMBLING & INTOXICATING LIQUOR 

NOT ALLOWED

Located On Main St. Sopora 

Open At 1 P.M. Daily 

Close At 9:30 P.M. Daily 

Except Wednesdays and Sundays

Owners; Mr & Mrs. H.E. Moore 
’ leeeeeeeoeoooeeeeeeeoeeeeeooeeooeoeeeeooeeeeA

Zenbier's Steak House
"Home of the Best"

Del Rio, Texas 
Now Features

CHICKEN FRIED STEAK $2.00
8 OZ. LUNCHEON STEAK $2.75

T ILL  3:00 P.M.
50< off on steaks ea. Tues. & Wed.

NOW OPEN NOON DAILY 
(Closed Mondays)

512-775-2621
4 Miles W. of 277 & 90 Y

Thursday, June 12
KING SIZE 
W A llEI 

CREATIVE 
COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY

c :  ß

- ■ »'¿tf I

Extra 
Charge 

for
GROUPS

%

.J - - '

NO
LIMIT

« I  NOUMS HIM or CUHH. 
CUWMl. DU. MOH MO lU IK  

linU 0M$ » IK K  UHE tow NKEU

STUDIOS
;«ATIV| C«i»A

SHUGART 
CSI.O 

PHOTOS
MITCH'S S O N O R A FOODS

105 East Main

WHOLEWHEAT BREAD

1 package active dry yeast 
V ii cups lukewarm water 
V/i cups milk 
1/4 tsp. salt 
3 Tbsp. brown sugar 
3 Tbsp. shortening 
6-7 cups unsifted whole 

wheat flour

Dissolve yeast In lukewarm 
water. Scald milk and pour in 
large bowl. Add salt, brown sugar 
and shortening to scalded milk. 
Stir until sugar dissolves. When 
milk mixture has cooled to 
lukewarm, add yeast mixture. 
Gradually add whole wheat 
flour. Stir well after each 
addition as whole wheat flour 
absorbs water slowly. When 
dough is stiff enough to handle, 
turn It onto a floured board and 
knead thoroughly, gradually 
adding as much of remainder of 
flour as necessary. Try to keep 
dough soft by kneading in only 
enough flour to keep it from 
sticking. All-purpose flour can be 
used when kneading. Place dough 
In well-greased bowl and let rise 
2-3 hours or until doubled in 
warm place. Punch down and 
shape into 2 loaves. Place in 
greased 9 x 5-inch loaf pans and 
allow  to rise until almost 
doubled, about 2 hours, still 
keeping dough warm. Bake at 
325 degrees for 114 hours, or 
until loaves sound hollow when 
tapped with fingers. Remove 
from pans and cool on wire rack.

KOLACHES 
’/• cup butter or shortening 
'4 cup sugar 
1 tsp. salt
3/4 cup scalded milk 
V4 cup water
1 cake compressed yeast 

(or 1 package dry granular 
yeast dissolved as directed 
on package)

1 egg
4 cups sifted flour

Cool milk to lukewarm by 
adding water. Combine butter, 
sugar and salt with milk. Add 
yeast and mix well. Blend in egg, 
Greduelly add sifted flour mix 
until blended. Roll out 4  inch 
thick on well-floured board; cut 
with 24  inch round cutter. Place 
on greased baking sheet. Let rite 
In warm place (80-85 degrees) 
until double in bulk, about 1 
hour. Press indentation in center 
of each bun. Place pitted, cooked 
prune or peach dipped in nuts in 
each indentation. Bake in 
350-degree oven 20 minutes. 

Topping
4  cup flour
2 Tbsp. or more melted or 

soft butter
2 Tbsp. sugar 
'/4 tsp. cinnamon

Mix ingredients. Crumble on top 
of each bun.

Six Flags, Inc. 
Takes O ver 
Asirow ofid

Six Flags, Inc. announced 
recently that it is assuming the 
management and operation of 
Houston’ s Astroworld  theme 
park.

Ned P. DeWitt, president of 
Six F lags, said his company 
has entered into a twenty-year 
lease with Astrodomain Corpo­
ration, owners o f the property. 
The terms o f the agreem ent 
call for a graduated scale o f 
lease payments. Six Flags also 
has an option to renew the 
lease for an additional ten 
years. The lease includes 
approximately forty-five acres 
o f undeveloped property 
surrounding the park.

Currently, Astroworld atracts 
just over one m illion visitors 
annually. The park was opened 
in 1968 and designed by the 
same architects who designed 
the three Six F lags parks in 
Dallas/Ft. Worth, Atlanta, and 
St. Louis. New  parks being 
built now o f the same size and 
quality o f  Astroworld  have a 
cost o f over $40,000,000.

■M

/

The Senior Range Judging team composed of Rick Powers, Mark Van Hoozer, Pania Friess 
and Jolie Stewart, was first place winner in the state contest held in San Angelo. Miss Friess 
was also high individnal in the contest. Powers placed second high individnal and Van 
Hoozer, fifth.
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1MA6 IH E  O HE  H E L P  B y  WILHELM 
T H Y E ,  A N I6 H T  WATCHMAN IN 
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TOOK  BOTH T H E  O O LP AWP SILVER 
M E P A L S  A T  t h e  FARiSCOMPETITiOM, 
IM P O R T E P  OAM APIAH L T P  ACTUAUy 
C P S T S 1 X 6 5  th a n  MANV POMESTICS*

"Vacation starts
next week!"

Before you leave, let our 
agency check your insur­
ance coverage for adequate 
protection - on your auto, 
camper, boat and motor, 
sporting goods, cameras 
and other personal belong­
ings. Consider Travel-Ac­
cident insurance, and es­
pecially family liability pro­
tection for possible injuries 
to others.

MORGAN&HUNT
INSURANCE

3ml

210 E..MAIN SONORA 
PH. 387-2676

A bride-to-be's 
First S t o p ............

The following brides and brides-to-be have made 
their selections wHh u s ..................

Beveriy McDonald, bride-elect of Wmiam Thompson 
Jane Sawyer, bride-elect of Carlos Wade Davis, Jr. 
Maggie Galbreath, bride-elect of David Walsb 
Dariette Ramsey, bride-elect of Lee Bloodworth 
Sarah AUson, bride-elect of Robert Post 
Linda Smith, bride-elect of Glenn Franklin 
Janice Nance, bride-elect of Samnel Woods 
Lilia Castro, bride-elect of Lionel Cervantes 
Irene Vasqnez, bride-elect of John Brown 

OdilU Baltazar, bride-elect of Bo Trainer 
Mrs. Kenneth Sledge, nee Regina Trainer 

Select a gift the bride has chosen herself!

STORE HOURS:

Monday - Friday 9:00 A.M. To 5:00 P.M. 
Saturday 1 - 5  p.m.

CONGRATULATIONS

To

Mary L. and Collier Shuriey

On Their

Fiftieth Wedding Anniversary

June 11, 1975

DR. GRAHAM LANTZ 
Optometrist

ANNOUNCES THE OPENING OF HIS OFFICE FOR 
THE PROFESSIONAL PRACTICE OF OPTOMETRY 

AT
612 BEDELL STREET 

DEL RIO, TEXAS

Practice Devoted To Complete Vision Care, Including 
Contact Lenses, Visual Training And Industrial Vision

OFFICE HOURS:
9:00 - 5:00 Monday - Friday 

9:00 - 1:00 Wednesday - Saturday 
Phone: 775-3141

Saifitóea feaneétf

These brides and bridas-ta-be have 
made particular selections with us .

Lilia Castro, bride-elect of Lionel Cervantez 
Maggie Galbreath, bride-elect of David Walsh 

Beveriy McDonald, bride-elect of William Tliompson 

Dariette Ramsey, bride-elect of Lee Bloodworth 

Jane Sawyer, bride-elect of Cairios Wade Davis, Jr. 

Charlotte Berkley, bride-elect of Brian McKee 

Odllla Baltazar, bride-elect of Bo 'Frafaier 
Janice Nance, bride-elect of Samnel Woods 

Linda Smith, bride-elect of Glenn F r a n k l i n  
Sarah Allison, bride-elect of Robert Post 
Mrs. Kenneth Sledge, nee Regina Trainer

First Baptist Chnrch

Rev. Clifton Hancock, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services7:00 p.m.

St. John’s Episcopal Church

Rev. Ray Nations, Rector 
Service Schedule:
Holy Communion
each Sunday 8 & 11 a.m.
Church School 10:00 a.m.

First Latin American 
Baptist Chnrch

Rev. Pablo Gomez 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship Services 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 6:00 p.m.
Worship Service 7:00 p.m.
WMU, Monday 7:00 p.m.

If she has kept up with the course all term, she’ll not flunk because of this nap. BUT— 
if she is counting on the midnight oil to pull her through the exam . . . Too bad!

You ve heard of people being converted to Christianity on their deathbed. True! As Christ 
promised salvation to a penitent thief on the cross, so God’s love reaches out even in the 
final hour to those who call on Him in faith.

But don t live your life on the dangerous principle that last-minute cramming will satisfy 
all your religious needs.

There will be millions of adults and children in church next Sunday. They are seeking spirit­
ual tmth, gaining Christian convictions. . . not because they need sortie religion to die with — 
because they need Faith to live by.

First United 
Methodist Chnrch

Rev. Paul Terry, Pastor 
Church School 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service 10:45 a.m.

If you do not worship at [ 
some other church we will be 
very happy to have you 
worship with us.

Church Of Christ

Roy McGaugh, Minister 
Bible School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Youth Group 5:00 p.m. 
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening7:30 p.m.

St. Ann’s Catholic Chorch
Rev. Michael Fernandez 

Weekday Mass:
Tues., 'ITlurs., Fri. 8:00 a.m.j 
Evening Mass:
Mon., Wed., Sat.
Sunday Masses

Holy Day Masses

7:00 p.m. 
8:00 a.m. 

10:00 a.m. 
7:00 a.m. 
7:00 p.m.

Hope Lntheran Chnrch
A.B. Wagner, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:20 a.m. 
Worship Services 11:00 a.m. 
“ The Lutheran H our”  6:30 
p.m.Sunday on radio KGKL, 
950. “ This Is The Life”  8:00 
a.m. Sundays on KCTV, 
Channel 8

I Copyright 1975 Keister Advertising Service, Inc., Strasburg. Virginia
Scriptures selected by The American Bible Society

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday
Numbers Zechariah Psalms Numbers Matthew John Romans

20:6-9 8:7-9 29:1-4 6:22-27 7:24-27 3:1-5 3:21-24

»ooocooeoooooooBOor

The Chnrch Of The 
Good Shepherd 

Presbyterian U.S.
Jim Miles

Sunday
Study Class 10:00^a.m. I
Coffee Fellowship 10:45 a.m. I 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m.j 
Wednesday 
Bible Classes 3 and 4 p.m. j

RATLIFF - KERBOW  

FUNERAL HOME

NEVILLE’S
Yonr Complete Dept. Store

THE
RUTH SHURLEY 

JEWELRY

SOUTHWEST TEXAS 

ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 

INCORPORATED 

Owned By Hiose It Serves
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For Sale

Must sell. 14 X 80 3 bedroom, 
fully carpeted mobile home. No 
equity, assume payments. Call 
387-2070 or 387-3594. Ic40

TEN ACRE residential tracts, 
five and ten acre commercial 
tracts. F ive m iles north o f 
town. 29 percent down, terms 
available. Call 387-2524. tf30

Used and rebuilt Maytag 
washers. Sonora Electric 
Company. 4c38

17 foot aluminum cabin cruiser 
with 35 h.p. motor, electric 
starter. $500. Call 387-3179.

tf38

2 bedroom house, den, storage 
shed. Freshly painted inside. 
210 Hudspeth. Phone 387-2965.

t£35

2'A acres in city limits. Has 12 
large mobile home spaces, 3 
bedroom house with 1500 
square feet, l ‘/j baths, garage. 
3 unit carport. Pecan and oak 
trees. Call 392-3201, Ozona 
after 5:30 p.m. 4c38

1

GENERAL TIRES

DEPENDABLE
SAFE

R .S . Teaff 
Oil Company

FINA GASOLINE 

Phone 387-2770 Sonora

For Sale
FOR SALE

NEW  2 and 3 bedroom 
homes from 1,000 to 1,700 
square feet of floor space, 
built under city inspections.

1 '/2  or 2 full baths with 
ceramic tile showers and 
dressing tables. Large 
kitchen-family room combi­
nations. Lots o f cabinets 
and snack bar. Built-in 
dishwasher and range with 
hood. Utility rooms or 
areas. All gas or all elec­
tric. Central Heating. Fully 
carpeted with window 
drapes installed. Complete­
ly finished and delivered to 
any place in W est Texas 
Area $12.75 per square 
foot. Can also brick all or 
part if desired and include 
refrigerated air all as an 
extra.

We invite you to come and 
look at what we have to 
offer. We have been in this 
business for over 20 years 
and guarantee satisfaction.

Call CRAIG HARDEGREE 
Burley Lumber Company 

San Angela, Texas 
655-3127

W anted
House painting, roofing and 
general carpenter repair work. 
Free estimates. Call 446-3117, 
Junction, or write Ray Davis, 
General Delivery, Roosevelt, 
Texas 76874. 8p40

Want to buy Spode china in 
Florence pattern. Service for 
four or more. Call 387-3246.

5c40

Suffolk Yearling R a p s |

f jÂ I
• '' ' *

Phone 396-Í276

JAN-CO RANG

' McKatii itj

Walter Pope

ALL NEW GREEN HOUSE 

In Eldorado

SATURDAY, JUNE 7

Door Prizes —  Drawing 5 P.M. 
204 East Field St.

One Block To The Right At 
Second Blinking Light

Frank I& Claryce Williams

For Sale
HANGING BASKETS are the 
going thing. W e have the 
baskets and many types o f 
ferns and blooming plants to 
make them attractive. Saund­
ers Flowers. Ic38

5 to 18 acre plots adjacent to 
city limits. Call 387-2524. tf36

67 Ford ton truck. Flatbed with 
3 foot removable sideboards. 
Call 387-3405 or 387-3427. 2c39

Two lots in Castle H ills 
addition. Call Mrs. Auther 
Carroll, 387-2996 or Darcy 
Carroll, 713-744-8415 in 
Galveston. tf38

W e have a new supply o f 
Dymo Labelmakers. $6.95. 
Devil’ s River News. nc38

ALL BUSINESS and residential 
property belonging to the 
Estate o f Mina Wright Hull is 
being o ffered  for sale. Mrs. 
Clayton Bray. Call 387-2412.

tf37

Refrigerated  air conditioner 
used three months. Good used 
electric grill. Two practically 
new panel ray heaters. Call 
Mrs. Jack Raye. 387-3026. 2p39

SELLING A T  AUCTION 
100 - Registered - 100 

Angus Females 
Tuesday, June 10, 1975 

12:30 P.M.
JUNCTION STOCK YARDS 

Junction, Texas 
R. E. “ Dick”  Homann, 

Chairman
915/446-2823 or 915/446-2137 

Consignors:
Martin Angus Farm, Mason, 
Tx.; J. V. Heyser, Cisco, Tx.; 
Allen Keller, Fredericksburg, 
Tx.; Llano Valley Angus Farm, 
Junction, Tx.; Lee Craven, 
Junction, Tx.; Joe Felps, 
Junction, Tx.; Leonard 
McGowan, Junction, Tx.; Grote 
Angus Ranch, Mason, Tx. 
This is strictly a quality 
o ffering. Cows and calves at 
side, and bred back. Two year 
old heifers, bred and open. 
Yearling heifers and heifer 
calves. Catalogs on Request. 

__________  2p39

1971 custom built trailer house. 
12 X 40, 2 bedroom, IV 2 ton 
central air conditioner. Call 
387-3647. Ip40

1967 Chevrolet pickup. H a lf 
ton, standard V-8. 1965
Chevrolet Impala, Super Sports 
327. Power and air, automatic. 
Call 387-3335. Ic40

For Sale
RUSTIC SWISS CH ALET 
CABIN  for sale. Octagon 
design, built o f solid rock walls 
4 feet high; flag stone floor; 2 
X 8 rafters; 1 x 12 cedar boards 
throughout; hand-split red 
cedar shakes; liv ing , dining 
and breakfast area in one; 
pass-closet into the bath; 
balcony upstairs for sleeping. 
Sell for cash only. Three blocks 
south o f H a ley ’ s tank truck 
place on Main St., Eldorado, 
Texas. H. B. Feddersen. Ip40

Good used gas range. $50. Call 
387-3498. Ic40

One bedroom trailer. Large 
living room $400 cash and take 
up payments. Call 387-9934 or 
387-3150. Ic40

3 bedroom house, large 
kitchen, fireplace, garage with 
store room, shop. In Sonora. 
Call 392-3505, Ozona. 3c40

For Reni
BEDROOMS AND A PA IIT - 
M ENTS Furnished. Monthly 
rates, bills paid. No Pets. Call 
Castle Courts, 387-2461. tf30

TRAILER SPACES available. 
Cahill-Young Park #2. Call 
387-2524. tf30

For Rent 

LA  C ASITA  luxury apart­
ments in residential neighbor 
hood. Over 1,000 square feet 
each unit. Two bedroom , 1 
bath - $295. Two bedroom, 2 
bath - $350. U tilities paid. 
Carports, washers, dryers. 
Unfurnished with floor length 
lined draperies and wall to 
wall carpeting. K itchen 
furnished with refrigerator, 
stove and dishwasher. Time 
lights. Call James Hunt. 
387-2713 during the day, 
387-3261 nights and w eek­
ends. 4q4o

Help W anted
Man needed for inside and 
yard sales. Some experience 
desirable but not necessary. 
Opportunity to advance to 
assistant manager for the right 
man who is willing to work and 
learn the lumber business. 
Apply at Foxworth-Galbraith in 
Sonora. 2c40

Dependable worker needed. 
Must have commercial license. 
Call Thorp ’ s Laun-Dry, 
387-2666. tf40

1964 Ford Fairlane. 64,000 
actual miles. Standard shift, 6 
cylinder, heater, radio. Call 
387-2943. tOO

Two bedroom home. Located at 
110 W. College. May be seen 
after June 9. Call Lee Roy 
Valliant, 387-2943. tf40

Garage Sale
Yard sale. All sizes men’s and 
wom en’ s clothing. Lamps, 
liv ing room suite, m is­
cellaneous items. 110 Oak.
Friday until................................
_____________________  lp40

A LL  TYPES ROOF REPA IR  
and quality roofs. Kent Elliott 
Roofing. 655-2800, San Angelo, 
Texas. tf30

STEEL PAINTING 
SAND BLAST AND PRIMER 

SPRAY PAINTING 
ACOUSTIC AND GLITTER

V a U N U E V A  P A IN TIN G
Agapito "Pete" Villanueva 

305 San Francisco St. Sonora. Texas

G E N E R A L P L A N N E D  U S E  R E P O R TR E V E N U E  S H A R I N G
General Revenue Sharing provides federal funds directly to local and state governments. This report of your grvemmeni’s'’pl^n ^  published 
to encourage citizen participation in determining your governments decision on how the money will be spent. Note- Any com plaints of 
discrimination in the use of these funds may be sent to ------------- --------------------------- --------I'lore Mny complaints of
the Office of Revenue Sharing. W ash., D .C. 20226.

PLANNED EXPENDITURES

(A) CATEGORIES IB) CAPITAL (Cl OPERATING /  
MAINTENANCE

1 PUBLIC SAFETY s $
2 ENVIRONMENTAL 

PROTECTION $ S
3 PUBLIC

TRANSPORTATION $ $
4 HEALTH $
5 RECREATION s $
6 LIBRARIES $ $
7 SOCIAL SERVICES 

FOR AGED OR POOR $ s
8 FINANCIAL 

ADMINISTRATION $ $
9 M ULTIPURPOSE AND 

GENERAL GOVT.

10 EDUCATION

11 SOCIAL 
DEVELOPMENT

12 HOUSING & COM­
MUNITY DEVELOPMENT

13 ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT

14 OTHER (SpeciM

$

s

s

s

$

s
15 TOTALS

$

TH E GO VERN M EN T  
OF •SUTTON cauriT)

ANTICIPATING A GENERAL REVENUE 
SHARING PAYMENT OF $ 6 Q j 9 4 9

FOR THE SIXTH ENTITLEMENT PERIOD. JULY 1, 1S75 THROUGH JUNE 30. 
1976. PLANS TO SPEND THESE FUNDS FOR THE PURPOSES SHOWN.

AccouNTNO. 44 J 2l8 2I8 
SUTTQfi COUNTY 1050
county j u d g e
SONORA TEXAS ?695u

(D) Submit proposals for funding consideration by.

1°-----^ A / > f  6 T~ ! --------------------------------- A copy of this report, and
supporting documents, are open for public scrutiny

at_df) t i  y __
.  a s s u r a n c e s  (Refer to instruction E) I assure the Secrstar^ of the Treasury 

that ti^ nqn-discrimination and other statutory requirements- iietetf-irv Part E of 
the instructioris accompanying this report wiH be complied with by this recipient 
govemment^th respecrtO'tffè entittemerttfuiŸds reported hereon*govemment^th

f Executive Officer

Hotice
Bette and Glenn Studios will 
conduct gymnastic classes on 
Tuesdays at the old Sonora 
High School gymnasium. 
Classes w ill be scheduled as 
follows:

1:00 p.m. - 5 to 7 year olds
2:00 p.m. - 8 to 11 year olds.
3:00 p.m. - 12 thru high 

school
Observers are welcome any 

Tuesday afternoon. Ip40

Bids wanted - two trucks - 
junkers - May be seen at HNG 
Propane yard. Contact Melton 
Murff. 2c40

Name & Title —  Please/*rin
C / i U f l / r < r  T t J
|m____________________________________ Date_____________

Business Services
H A N N A H ’ S husband Hector 
hates hard work so he cleans 
the rugs with Blue Lustre. 
Rent electric shampooer $1. 
White’s Auto Store. Ic

FOR EXPERT HELP and 
quality home furnishings, see 
the friendly folks at BROWN 
FURNITURE C O M PAN Y  in 
Ozona. W e have “ everything 
for your home” . tf30
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MOBILE HOME INSURANCE- 
Insure your mobile home with 
Foremost Insurance Company, 
specialists in mobile home 
insurance worldwide. HATCH 
MOBILE HOMES, INC., ag ­
ent. 2150 N. Main, Junction, 
Texas (915) 446-2036. tf27

STA-PUT CARPET Company. 
1110 Avenue E, Ozona. Free 
estimates and measurements.

tf30

MOBILE HOM E M O V IN G - 
Anywhere in the state. HATCH 
MOBILE HOMES INC., 2150 
N. Main, Junction, Texas (915) 
446-2036. tf27

G ENERAL C AR PE N TRY, re ­
modeling and addition. Contact 
Ollie Joy at 387-2828. 3p38

Livestock For Sale
Make your choice earlyl 
Coming 2-year-old registered 
Angus bulls. JUNO RANCH  
COMPANY, Frank Fish. Call 
JY4-6804. tf40

Public Notice
CONTRACTORS’ NOTICE OF 

TEXAS HIGHWAY  
CONSTRUCTION 

Sealed proposals for con- 
strnctlng 7.023 miles of Gra., 
Strs., Flex. Bs. & Partial 'Two 
Crse. Snrf. Trt. [Stage I 
Const.]

From 6.5 Ml. W . of Kimble 
Co. Line To Kimble Co. Line 
From Sutton Co. Line To 0.5 
Mi. E. on Highway No. IH 10, 
covered by I 10-3[36] 429 in 
Sntton & Kimble County, wUI 
be received at the Highway 
Department, Austin, nntll 9:00 
A. M., June 19, 1975, and then 
publicly opened and read 
THIS CONTRACT IS SUBJECT 
TO THE WORK HOURS ACT 
OF 1962, PL-87-581 AND  
IM PLEM ENTING REGULA- 
■noNS.

The State Highway Depart­
ment, in accordance with the 
provisions of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 [78 
Stat. 252] and the Regulations 
of the U. S. Department of 
Transporation [15 C. F. R., 
Fart 8], issued pursuant to 
such Act, hereby notifies all 
bidders that It will affirm­
atively Insnre that the contract 
entered into pnrsnant to this 
advertisement will be awarded 
to the lowest responsible 
bidder without discrimination 
on the ground of race, color, or 
national origin, and further 
that It will affirmatively Insnre 
that In any contract entered 
into pnrsnant to this adver­
tisement, minority bnslness 
enterprises wlU be afforded foil 
opportunity to snbmit bids in 
response to this Invitation and 
will not be discriminated 
against on the grounds of race, 
color, or national origin In 
consideration for an award.

Flans and specifications 
Inclndlng mlnlmnm wage rates 
as provided by Law are 
available at the office of Joe 
W. Lane, Resident Engineer, 
Sonora, Texas, and Texas 
EQghway Department, Austin. 
Usual rights reserved. 2c40

T/PS
I t  takes two to tango, 

but now you can ski alone.
Who would ever have 

thought o f inventing a boat 
that pulls a skiier with no­
body —  yes, nobody —  
aboard the craft? That’s 
sumpthin’ —  and it ’s here.

Complete outfit consists 
of a sleek two-foot high, 
six - foot long fiberglass 
boat with a three foot 
beam, to the stem of 
which is attached a 35-foot 
long flexible rubber-covered 
cable — customarily called 
a tow-rope. But in this 
instance it serves other 
purposes than to-wing. T\vo 
o f these purposes are, to 
guide the boat (including

making o f 360° and “ S” 
turns); and to control ac­
celeration (including take­
o ff and up to 40 mph 
straight-away speed).

Despite the fact that the 
boat’s footage is 6x3x2 its 
plastic body holds a built-in

American Sales and Service

Hi-Pressure Sfeam Cleaners 
and Hot Water Hi-Pressure 

Washers 
Magnetic Drills 

Magnetic Sweeper Service 
Chemicals, Degreasers 

Also Have Used Units
Alton Towery Box 7252 

Ph. 915/381-1995 
Odessa, Texas 79760

b y  V e r n  S a n f o r d

gasoline tank in the bow 
and a 40 hp jet-drive water- 
cooled engine in the stem. 
I t ’s a trim little r ig  that 
very likely will add consid­
erable zoom to the pleasure 
of skiing.

This outfit should prove 
the sensation o f upcoming 
boat shows since it elimi­
nates the need o f a big, 
heavy, high-powered craft, 
a driver and an observer.

In this case the driver is 
the skiier. That umbilical 
cord, as they call it, has 
two handles that serve to 
control the boat.

Whether this skidaddling 
Ski-wheee is legal or not is 
something else. Don’t know 
why it shouldn’t be, except 
that safety regulations pres­
ently require that all boats 
towing skiiers must carry 
a driver and either an ob­
server or a wide-angle rear 
view mirror. 'That likely 
will be a technicality which 
can be overlooked in this 
instance.

SAN ANGELO CONCRETE 
PRECAST SEPTIC TANKS

500 Gal. Concrete 
Septic Tanks $95,00

Delivery Service Available
Louis Villarreal 

2321 South Bryant Blvd.
San Angelo

Ph. 915 - 653-6821 
Ph. 915 - 653-8286

D O  IT 
Y O U R S ELF 
A N D  
S A V E
We have in stock nearly everything 
anyone will need to have home 
repairs completed.

Foxw orfb GalbraHh Lum ber Co.
f  hone 387-2536 Sonora

Pecans Trees Siiould Be Exam ined 
For Presence O f Nuf Casebearer Eggs

Pecan trees are rapidly 
recovering from the freezing 
weather o f March and home- 
owners and orchardists should 
begin to examine developing 
nutlets for the presence o f 
pecan nut casebearer eggs. 
The ^eenish-white to reddish 
colored casebearer egg  is 
usually laid on the base of the 
developing nutlet and is barely 
visible to the naked eye. Eggs 
hatch three to five days after 
being laid by the light gray 
colored casebearer moth. 
Warm , still nights are par­
ticularly condusive to moth 
activity and pecan producers 
should be aware o f  environ­
mental conditions that favor 
moth fligh t and egg  laying 
activities.

The worm, or larval, stage of 
the casebearer is regarded as 
the most serious early season 
pest o f  pecans. A  single 
casebearer larva can frequently 
destroy an entire cluster o f 
nuts. In addition, each adult 
moth is capable o f  laying in 
excess o f 150 eggs. Damaged 
nutlets soon darken and bits of 
grass and webbing may be 
observed projecting fi’om the

injured nuts.
Several insecticides are 

available to the homeowner for 
pecan nut casebearer control 
with a w ider selection o f 
insecticides being labeled for 
commercial use. Pecan pro­
ducers may want to incorporate 
zinc sulfate and a fungicide 
with their pecan nut casebearer 
insecticide to control disease 
and improve the general 
nutritional state of their trees.

CONCHO
CONSTRUCTION CO.

Residential - Commercial 
Remodeling

Painting
Steel Construction 

Borns & Pens

3000 Travis 
Son Angelo, Texas

Buck Bodgett 
Ph. 653-1862

Wesley Crooks 
Ph. 653-1585 

Mobile: 653-2066

NEW IN SONORA

Julio's Electric
(Licensed & Bonded)

Julio's Janitor Service
Offices —  Shops —  Residences 

Planning a party?

CALL JULIO TO CLEAN BEFORE & AFTER 
387-2469

Remember

Supplies the energy- 

but only YOU can 

use it wisely!

REDDY'S HELPFUL 
FREEZER TIPS

Lock in flavor: Use moisture and vapor-proof 
materials especially designed for freezers to 
wrap your foods. Tightly sealed, these lock 
in flavor and moisture and prevent “freezer 
burn" (surface drying) on foods. Don't use 
wox paper, bread paper or regular cellophane 
for freezer foods.

Label packages: Date and identify freezer 
packages so (1) you don't accumulate o lot of 
mysterious shapes and (2) you'll be able to pick 
out foods that have been in the freezer longest.

Toke advantage of sales: Avoid overstocking with 
commercially frozen food that's always avalloble; 
use your freezer as your own bargain counter and 
store foods you con buy on sate. But do allow 
space for short-time baked goods, leftovers and 
special party foods.

Pick up your FREE copy of 
"ENERGY CONSERVATION" 

Booklet from

■HjlHgldalre
» IBI PMili« «« 0«iiw«l M

West Texas Utilities Company An Equal 
î PoHurWy Employer



The Devil’s River News, Sonora, Texas Thursday, June 5, 1975

That scientific term " astron au t” is rather romantic in the 
original Greek. A ston  means star and n au tes  sailor, so an 
“ astronaut" is one who sails an’ ong the stars.

EpmSHUGART COUPON 
Thursday, June 12
MITCH'S SONORA FOODS 

105 East Main

9
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS
. . . . . . .  9 9 4f  ASK V ̂ Abowl Oor ♦

i  IF IS IliE  5 Extra charge 
I s  X 10/ for 

GRO UPS
* * * * * * S B ».T.T.TX.T.T.X.T.T.T.

BENSON R EP A IR  SERVICE

402 S E Water Ave. 

Sonora, Texas

Will Be Closed For Vacation

June 6 -  22

THE 
FAMILY 
LAWYER

Missing Letter
There is something reassuring 

about the click of the mailbox 
latch, as your important letter 
slides down and out of sight. 
Whether you are making an in­
surance payment or meeting a 
tax deadline or completing a bus­
iness deal, you feel relief: “Well, 
that’s taken care of.”

;

;

But what if the other party, 
perhaps weeks or months after­
ward, insists that your letter 
never arrived? I f  it came to a 
showdown in court, how would 
you stand?

Fortunately, the law offers you 
a helping hand in the form of a 
"presumption.” That is, the law 
will presume that the letter did 
arrive, provided you had the cor­
rect amount of postage and the 
correct address. As one court 
explained:

“It is a presumption founded 
on the probability that (postal 
employees) will do their duty.'

Furthermore, you may get the 
benefit of the presumption even 
if the letter was not placed di­
rectly into a mailbox. One court 
applied the presumption to a let­
ter handed to a mailman (while 
on duty). Another court applied 
it to a letter dropped into the 
mail chute of an office building.

However, there are limits. The 
presumption was denied when a 
man simply left some mail in an 
open lobby, in the expectation 
that the mailman would eventual­
ly pick it up

Furthermore, like most pre­
sumptions, this one is subject to 
being defeated if there is suffi­
cient evidence against it.

In one case, an embattled 
debtor claimed to have mailed an 
important legal notice to the of­
fice of his creditors. But in a 
court hearing, both partners in 
the firm took the witness stand 
and solemnly swore that the no­
tice had never been received.

Then their bookkeeper took 
the stand and swore the same 
thing.

This testimony was enough to 
convince the court that the letter 
had indeed failed to reach its 
destination. It was more likely, 
said the court, either that the 
debtor had neglected to put it in 
the mail or that the post office 
had— for once— neglected to do 
its duty.

SOLID STAINLESS by ONEIDA

Save now on tall drink spoons in 
carefree stainless by Oneida 

and add a special touch of elegance 
to your summer entertaining.

SET OF 4
TALL DRINK SPOONS

COMMUNITY®
STAINLESS

(Regular $12.00)

Patterns, top 
to bottom: 
Coronation* 
Paul Revere* 
Louisiana* 
Madrid* 
Venetia* 
Froslfire*

ONEIDA®
DELUXE STAINLESS

(Regular $9.00)

Patterns, top 
to bottom: 
Mozart*
Modern Antique* 
Che rie*
Nordic Crown*
Chateau*
Capistrano*

HURRY! OFFER ENDS AUGUST 31, 1975

□ONEIDA
The Sliver cube. Our silversmiths' mark excellence.

•Trademarks of Onctda Ltd.

The Ruth Shurley Jewelry

-v''-
;

4K

■ 4 \

Lee Burch, alternate. Brad Johnson, Sahrina Allison and Tammy Van Hoozer placed first in 
thé state contest held May 17 in San Angelo. Brad Johnson was the high individual of the 
show, with Sabrina Allison placing second and Tammy Van Hoozer placing third. This team 
competed in the junior range judging division.

Texas Is Hosfing Tw o Different 
Growing Screwworm Populaiions

“ W e seem to have two 
d ifferent screwworm popula­
tions in T exas ,’ ’ says Dr. 
James E. Novy, d irector o f 
field operations for the U. S. 
Department o f  Agriculature 
(U SD A) Screwworm Eradi­
cation Program.

One is grow ing from  the 
South Texas over-w intering 
area. The other is “ spearing’ ’ 
into the Trans-Pecos and Hill 
Country region. This strong 
invasion is bolstered by 
increasing populations of this 
parasite o f  all warm blooded 
animals south o f the Rio 
Grande River in Mexico’s State 
o f Coahuila.

Consistently warm weather 
in much o f the Trans-Pecos

WOeiP.^ LARGEST 
(JENEBATOR -THO USM  STILL IN 

THE PLANNING S T A G E -- W ILL, 
WMEU COMPLETEP, gE AgLE T o  

PPOPUCE 2.£CD,tXX> tZIlOW ATTS!

N E W  W liU P  O F
UWPEKWAT£(2 FolUEB G AgLE 

MAS PEEW CPEATEP g v  IT T 'S  
5T A N P A P P  T E LE F O N -O G  

IC A g E L F A B E H i A /G  DIVISION
t h a t  w i l l  a l l o w  P O W ER - 

G e m e r a t i n G f a c i l i t i e s  t o  b e  
l o g a t e p  s o  f a k  o f f s h o r e ,
TH EV WON T POLLUTE AIR OR WATER'.

and Hill Country with weekly 
rains o f a half inch or more 
have created an environment 
favorable to the screwworm fly. 
Stormy conditions and heavy 
“ smaze”  have severely hamp­
ered aerial distribution o f 
sterile screwworm flies.

Novy comments that the 
screwworm population in 
Texas’ eight southmost coun­
ties is statistically losing 
ground as reports o f  cases 
farther north in the state 
increase.

Counties recording their first 
officially confirmed cases of the 
year during the first half o f 
M ay were: Bandera, Blanco, 
Bee, Coryell, Crockett, Gilles­
pie, Hamilton, Kendall, Mave­
rick, Pecos, Presidio, Sutton, 
Terrell, and Zavala. Forty-nine 
Texas counties had laboratory 
confirmed infestations by May 
16.

Real Estate 
Transfers

WD/VL - John Turman et ux 
to Joe Jiminez et ux Lot 11, 
Blk 55-A, South Heights Addn.

WD - Mrs. Sam E Jones to 
Mrs. Bill (T ina ) W hitehead 
W/2 Lot 2 & all Lot 3, Blk 
W-40

WD/VL - Billy R Mayfield et 
ux to J T  Hill et ux E/2 Lots 9 
& 10, Blk E-7

WD - Est o f Mina Hull to 
Mrs. Brenda Blaskia, Pt Lot 5, 
Blk W-34, lying W  o f and 
adjoining Lot 7, said block

LOCALS PLACE IN 
OZONA HORSE SHOW

Marshal Doran, Sutton 
County 4-H’er, placed first in 
the reg istered  mare division 
and fifth in the registered aged 
mare division, during the May 
24 horse show held in Ozona. 
Also placing in the show was 
Tonia Mittel, who held seventh 
place in the adult western 
pleasure class.

Fillies Claim 
Lead In Girl's 
SoHball League

The team of Fillies, coached 
by Mrs. Cathy Preston, is in 
first place standing after 
winning all three games played 
since the girl’ s softball league 
was form ed in M ay. The 
games are played each Monday 
night and teams are composed 
o f girls age nine through 
twelve. The league moved to 
the park across from the Dairy 
Mart Wednesday night.

In second place standing are 
the Squaws, coached by Mrs 
Carolyn Sorenson. The Cow­
girls, coached by Mrs. Wanda 
H alford, have third place 
standing, and M rs. Vanetta 
Sm ith’ s Rangerettes are in 
fourth place.

The teams are still in need 
o f volunteers and donations. 
Anyone desiring to aid the 
teams are asked to contact 
M mes. Betty Stewart, M ar­
garet Clawson, Linda Carta 
Patsy Schwiening or Gerald 
Tinney.

If you don’t succeed in getting to FIRST NATIONAL 

B ANK  before closing time - use our Night 

Depository to safeguard yonr cash and cnrrency. 
Remember, too, onr Bank-By-Mail envelopes 

for ease in making deposits.
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Sening the D erifs River Country

A  Bishop 
Looks at Life

By Everett H. Jones, Retired 
Bishop of the Episcopal Church

Where Is The 
Backbone of America?

I have a friend who is a 
sculptor. His name is Malcolm 
Alexander, and he is the 
stepson o f Mrs. Donald 
Alexander o f San Antonio.

In the past Malcolm  has 
made a name for himself both 
as a painter and as the creator 
in bronze o f athletes in action. 
(One o f his athletic figures 
was given to the late Avery 
Brundage, former chairman of 
the Olympic Committee, on his 
85th birthday and will soon be 
placed in the Olympic Museum 
in Olympia, Greece.)

Malcolm is now making his 
contribution to the Bicentennial 
celebration o f America thru a 
new series o f sculptures called 
“ The Backbone of America.”

He explains the project in 
these words: “ America needed 
a Washington, a Jefferson, a 
Lincoln and all the other 
leaders. But Am erica also 
needed the unknown and 
unsung working people who 
pioneered, struggled, and set 
the course of the nation and its 
heritage.”

One o f his pieces in the new 
series is called “ The Washer­
woman.”  It shows the pioneer 
woman bending over her 
washboard set in the wooden 
tub so common in early 
Am erica. O f this piece, he 
says: “ H ere is the w ife, 
mother, lover, who worked 
silently and alone in the 
shadow o f her man. Her 
strength is not only in the 
character that holds the family 
together--her role is the 
selfless ‘keeper o f the flame’ in 
the home, the citadel o f 
America.”

Another piece is called “ The 
Birth of the Blues.”  It depicts 
two black men, one older and 
one younger in a relaxed pose 
on the New Orleans docks. The 
young one is playing a battered 
old coronet, and the old one is 
clutching his cherished 
harmonica.

“ The old man was once a 
s la ve ,”  says M alcolm . “ He 
worked and sang the songs of

the conditions o f his lot as he 
worked in the fields. His music 
came from A frica , later to 
develop into the early black 
spirituals, a necessary ingre­
dient for keeping his spirit 
alive. Now he hears a young 
dock worker playing his 
coronet--new sounds evolve 
from this young man’s head- 
music influenced by the funeral 
dirge and the marching band. 
Both men listen to the sounds 
of the other-it is ‘the birth of 
the blues.’ ”

As 1 responded to Malcolm’s 
figures and his interpretation 
of them I asked myself these 
questions: Who are the
persons that represent the 
backbone o f Am erica today? 
What can we do to recognize 
and honor these persons 
during our Bicentennial? How 
can I in some way be part of 
the backbone of America?

B .i.d . and t.i.d . on prescrip­
tions are abbreviations for 
the Latin terms b is in d ie  
meaning twice a day and 
tres in d ie  meaning three 
times a day.

Major Home Appliance 
Service

of San Angelo 
Will have an appliance 

serviceman in Sonora 
each Thursday

For Service Call:
San Angelo 655-1013 

Sonora 387-3151

BUCK KNIVES
FAMOUS FOR 
HOLDING AN EDGE

(Franchise Dealer) 
BARROW JEWELRY 

&
SPORTING GOODS
Sonora. Te.xas 76950
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WEED EATER

FOUR TOOLS FOR THE PRICE OF ONE

"N EED IE" is described as safe because it trims, edges, 
mows and sweeps without metal blades. "N EED IE"  
uses a specially treated nylon monofilament "fishing 
line". Over 40 feet of line is housed in a patented 
nylon cutting head. When the cord becomes worn, 
more can be quickly pulled out.

N E E D I E
T R I M S  A R O U N D  T R E E S ,  F E N C E S  A N D  
A N Y T H I N G  T H A T  S T A N D S  S T I L L .  
E D G E S  S I D E W A L K S ,  D R I V E W A Y S  A N D  
F L O W E R  B E D S .
MOWS W I T H  A  1 7 "  C U T T I N G  C A P A C I T Y  
IN T H O S E  " H A R D  T O  G E T  T O  P L A C E S " .  
S WE E P S  S I D E W A L K S  A N D  D R I V E W A Y S  
C L E A N  IN S E C O N D S .

How to cut grass 
with fishing fine.

V

# I  THE NEEDIE BY1 WEED EATER
W hite's Auto Store

Sonora
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