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Group Explains 
Housing Proposal 

BY BILL ELLIS 
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Members of the Bovina Housing 
Authority spoke to a group of just 10 
residents Tuesday night of last week 
in City Hall. 

Chairman Billy Whitecotton ex-
plained the short history of the 
Authority, noting a survey had been 
conducted which showed a definite 
need for additional, adequate 
housing for newly hired teachers, 
the elderly and others who find 
employment in the area. 

Whitecotton described a day trip 
he and member Jay Sherrill took to 
a project in Quitaque, which 
involves an area of some 20 acres, 
with construction temporarily lim-
ited to 10 acres. 

According to Whitecotton, the 
Quitaque Authority constructed 
housing, starting with five units, on 
every third lot and sold the two lots 
between. Streets, sewers and water 
were installed. The houses are brick 
duplex and rent for $125-$175 per 
month. The FmHA provided the 
necessary money at 3 per cent for 50 
years. The project has been 
underway for 21/2  years and is 
reported as having had no difficulty 
renting the units. 

Continuing, the local chairman 
said in answer to a question, the 
tenants can be forced, if necessary, 
to keep up the condition of the 

dwellings and a financial penalty 
can be applied if this is not done. 

As to tax liability, it was 
explained, a 10 per cent tax fee is 
assessed on the total annual income 
of the project. This fee is in lieu of 
local property taxes and, in most 
cases, the fee is higher than the tax 
would be. 

In a long but reasonably congenial 
exchange with some of those at the 
meeting, there was debate pertain-
ing to tax obligations in relation to 
schools, sewers, streets and curbing, 
with references made to local 
"government houses" and their 
alleged condition. 

It was explained by Authority 
members that after meeting with 
Bill Boling and Roy Rogers, a grant 
of $25,000 was made available to 
Parmer and Deaf Smith Counties to 
assist Housing Authorities. So far as 
is known, Bovina has the only 
Authority being helped at this time. 

Emphasizing that the local group 
is not yet committed, Whitecotton 
acknowledged they have more 
interest in the elderly at this time 
and might decide that help for the 
elderly will be their No. 1 priority. 

Answering another question, 
member Don Spring stated a 
housing authority, once established, 
retains its identity and power Whitecotton Proves 

He's "Upset Champ" Local Women 
Attend Rally 

indefinitely, even if it is not always 
active. 

Pictures of the Quitaque project, 
taken by Whitecotton, were passed 
among the residents present. In 
addition, architects' drawings of the 
same sites were available for 
examination. The Authority is 
inclined to favor similar housing in 
Bovina. 

When asked if the rent would 
include utilities, the answer was 
that, based on a recommendation of 
the FHA, "not to enter the utility 
business," there are no plans to tie 
utility bills into the rent. 

Procedural steps were explained, 
including the fact that members 
hold staggered terms, so the 
Authority will not be without 
experienced members. 

Among those who spoke, there 
appeared to be a predominantly 
negative attitude, with previous bad 
experiences being stressed. One 
person objected to the "already-
oppressive regulation of community 
and private life by the federal 
government." 

When the meeting adjourned, 
however, several attendees con-
gratulated the Authority members 
and offered the opinion that new 
housing can be a good undertaking 
for people and the city if the 
problems which might arise are 
handled promptly and diligently. 

Based on answers to questions and 
information given at Tuesday 
night's meeting, the Authority 
appears to have done its homework, 
and statements of individual 
members demonstrated a prevailing 
optimism that a housing project can 
be successful. It does not have to be 
an "eyesore" or a "burden to the 
community." 

30,435 
bales of cotton had 
been ginned in Par- • 
mer County as of 
Tuesday. 

Mrs. Leon Schilling, after telling 
of the rally, said: "I have never been 
involved in this kind of thing, but I 
believe it to be a threat to all I hold 
dear and I am determined to be 
involved now. 

"We had more people at our 
gathering than 'they' did, but we 
received very little, if any, publicity. 
Very few people even know about 
the threat we face from elements in 
the ERA movement. The newspap-
ers, radio and TV are strangely 
silent about all this, and they just 
about ignore us completely." 

HAS THERE EVER BEEN a more 
mild fall on the High Plains of 
Texas? If so, then this reporter can't 
recall it. We have heard more than 
one area farmer call the 1977 fall 
season the best they have ever seen. 

True, the area is beginning to get 
in a dry state of affairs, but from a 
harvest standpoint, one could not 
have asked for more cooperation 
from the weather. 

The corn harvest was concluded 
virtually without interruption or 
fanfare. Where last season there 
were long lines and waiting at the 
elevators, this did not develop this 
year. Of course, the lighter yields 
contributed somewhat to this 
phenomenon as well. 

Cotton harvest is still on, but is 
"over the hump." The cotton people 
could not have had a better season, 
from start to finish, if they had 
"charted" the weather, from 
planting through harvest. It has just 
been one of those rare years in that 
respect. 

About the only way that the fall 
season could be any better would be 
for the cotton harvest to wind up, 
and then have the area receive an 
inch of rain, or a foot of snow, 
whichever was the most handy. 

And, the way mother nature has 
cooperated up to now, we aren't 
counting this possibility out; in fact 
we're about nine-tenths certain that 
it will happen. 

+ + + + 
LAST SATURDAY, we took our 
number one son and went up to 
watch West Texas State University 
set a number of school and Missouri 
Valley Conference records while 
destroying Tulsa University in 
football, 57-21. 

We were amazed, and a bit 
saddened, that WTSU has such a fine 
team, and yet had so few fans out to 
watch them perform. 

It looks from here as though the 
Buffaloes have latched onto a rare 
find in first-year head coach Bill 
Yung, who seems to have that 
"certain something" that gets a 
winning performance out of a squad. 

And we definitely think, as we 
have stated before, that the addition 
of Max Sherman as president of 
WTSU was one of the best things that 
could have happened to the Canyon 
university. 

We look for the support for WTSU 
from the general area to make a 
good gain in the near future. If the 
city of Amarillo would get behind the 
university and its programs, as it 
should, then its future would indeed 
be rosy. 

Restaurant To Close 
operation. We tried everything we 
could think of, including many 
suggestions from others. We can 
now understand the attitude of past 
owners and their problems. 

"The people of Bovina are the 
friendliest I have met anywhere and 
I feel sorry for the few steady 
customers that were attracted to the 
restaurant. The decision to close 
was not of a personal nature. It 
boiled down to what was in our own 
best interests. Again, I regret it had 
to come to this." 

upsets chose a good one when they 
tapped Colorado State over 12th-
ranked Arizona State, and the 
stunning 45-7 smashing of Texas 
Tech by Houston didn't help the 
fortunes of the more orthodox 
contestants. 

In the pro ranks, three underdog 
teams upset favorites, New Eng-
land, New Orleans and Pittsburgh 
taking the measure of Buffalo, 
Atlanta and Dallas. 

Billy Whitecotton is this week's 
first-place winner with 11 correct 
games, and he picks up the $7.50 
prize. His three wrong predictions 
were Vega over Petersburg, 
Memphis over Sunray and Atlanta 
over New Orleans. 

Two players were able to reach 
the 10-point mark. They were 
Aubrey Parson of Friona and Claude 
Tamez, Jr. The tie-breaker was used 
to determine second and third 
places. 

The Houston-Seattle score was 
22-10. Tamez, 32-7 (13), cops second 
place and $5, while Parson gets third 
and $3 on a guess of 42-27 (37). 

Allen Cumpton, on top for four of 
the last five weeks and tied for first 
place one week, continues to lead the 
parade. He dropped below his 
average this week, but no one else 
could take advantage of it, so he still 
enjoys a lead of two points, at 113, 
while his closest challengers, 

(Continued on Page 81 

In the 11th week of the Bovina 
Businesses Football Contest, the 
competitors were presented a slate 
of games they could not master and 
the result was the lowest set of 
scores to date. 

Upsets dotted the list from 
schoolboy playoffs to three of the 
four pro games and sheer luck was a 
bigger factor than knowledge and 
analysis. 

Monterey, heavy pre-game fa-
vorite, had to battle for its playoff 
life to pull out a fingernail-thin 7-0 
victory over Tascosa. 

Although outplayed throughout 
the second half, Sunray used 
Memphis turnovers to advantage in 
its 17-7 Class A playoff win. 

Undefeated Perryton beat An-
drews, 24-6, but the statistics showed 
the Rangers had a real struggle with 
their opponents before hearing the 
welcomed final gun. 

Petersburg's Buffaloes gained an 
easy 21-6 triumph over Vega's 
Longhorns with 240 rushing yards 
against a Vega defense which had 
allowed only 37 points in 10 previous 
games during the season. 

The annual Michigan-Ohio State 
fracas, almost as traditional as pie 
or ice cream, seems to fluctuate 
from lop-sided, tunaway scores to 
very few points and close games. 
This was the year for the razor-edge 
finish and it ended, 14-6, Michigan. 

Prognosticators who enjoy picking 

+ + + + 
LEON WATSON, who was employed 
by us until recently, came by with a 
note the other day that indicated just 
how far a "national" television spot 
can reach. 

Leon's brother in Frankfort, 
Germany, saw the recent TV 
interview and commentary which 
was produced in Bovina, concerning 
the financial plight of area farmers. 

The news was shown on an 
American Armed Forces television 
station, located in Germany. 

+ + + + 
GOOD LUCK to the contestants in 
our football contest, as it gets down 
to brass tacks. 

Our goal, while picking out the 
games included on the list for 
contestants to consider each week, is 
to select games that will produce the 
most variation in choices, and 
thereby create more fluctuation 
among contestants and their scores. 

When we have weeks (like this 
past one) when scores are lower 
than average, then we feel like we 
have done our job. On weeks when 
the scores are high, we feel like we 
failed to some extent. 

We appreciate all of the folks who 
took part in our contest this year, 
helping make it the success that it 
was. 

We also take this opportunity to 
thank the several sponsors whose 
advertising spots make the contest 
possible year after year. 

Your support gives a number of 
sports fans something to look 
forward to each year. We know that 
they appreciate it, too. 

Pete Polston, Jr., manager of 
Hobo's Restaurant, told The Blade 
last Friday that the restaurant will 
be closed permanently, going out of 
business on Saturday, Nov. 26. 

He said an auctioneer will be in 
Bovina on Wednesday, Nov. 30, and 
all equipment in the building will be 
auctioned off. 

Polston said: "We kept our word 
on the menus and the fact that we 
would not serve leftovers. The result 
of keeping that promise was that we 
threw away more food than we 
served. 

"There simply has not been 
enough patronage from the commu-
nity to make for a profitable 

Five Bovina residents, alarmed by 
what they view as a threat to 
traditional home life in this country 
by International Women's Year 
advocates and ERA activists, 
traveled by bus to Houston last 
Friday to attend the Family Rally 
Day in the Astro-Arena on Saturday. 

Mesdames Leon Schilling, Joe 
Schilling, Eugene Schacher, Phil 
Brockman and Jim Heard joined 
some 15,000 others in what is said to 
have been a bigger assembly than 
was attracted to the IWY convention 
held at the same time, also In 
Houston. 

The rally was organized by the 
Women Who Want To Be Women and 
was attended by men and women 
from each of the 50 states. The 
Bovina spokesmen stated that 60 bus 
loads of people came from 
Tennessee, citing this as an example 
of the interest shown in the 
proceedings. 

They said, also, that 300,000 signed 
petitions have been collected and 
will be shipped to the president and 
the Congress. The theme of the 
petition is "From 'U.S.' To The 
President and Congress." 

The program included speeches 
by prominent authors, politicians, 
doctors, clergy and civic leaders and 
the business sessions involved the 
passing of pertinent resolutions. 
Musical presentations were offered 
by a number of well-known groups 
and individuals. Around 

Bovina 
HOLIDAY CLOSING 

The Post Office, First State Bank 
and most business institutions will 
be closed on Thursday in observance 
of Thanksgiving Day. Mail on routes 
will not be delivered, although the 
lobby will be open for box holders. 

BASKETBALL CAUTION 
Regarding the basketball season 

you are invited to patronize the 
concession stand, but for reasons a 
maximum safety for players am 
spectators, the care-taking am 
appearance of the varsity gymna 
sium, please do not take food o 
drinks into the gymnasium. 

HOUSING AUTHORITY....Pictured 
following a Tuesday night meeting 
are, left to right, Jay Sherrill, 
Chairman Billy Whitecotton, Don 

contest. Blade editor Dick Jones 
presents Whitecotton a check for 
$7.50. His score also moved him up in 
the standings, as he trails the leader 
by just four points. 

Spring and Mrs. Jane Kassahn. Not 
available when the picture was 
taken was member Edward Isaac 
and alternate Laurence Kriegel. 

WEATHER ANNOUNCEMENTS 
Bovina residents are encourage 

to tune in either of the radio station 
listed below regarding informatio 
on weather conditions affectinc, 
school opening or closing and bus 
routes: 

KZOL AM (1570), Farwell, 7 a.m. 
to 5:45 p.m. AC 806-481-3318. 

KGNC AM (710), Amarillo, 7 to 9 
a.m. AC 806-355-9801. 

WEEK'S CHAMPION 	Billy 
Whitecotton, left, longtime partici-
pant in the Bovina Businesses 
football contest, rang the bell with 11 
correct predictions this past week 
and claimed first place in the weekly 
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A well-stocked 

medicine cabinet 

is important. Get 

quality items . . 

here. We fill pre-

scriptions accu-

rately, too. 

Don's 
MEDICINE CHES 

Phone 238-1659 

20 YEARS AGO—NOV. 20, 1957 
Evelyn Joyce Steelman, a senior 

student at West Texas State College, 
Canyon, and daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Amos Steelman, Bovina, began 
practicing teaching in the local 
school on Monday. 

Hampered, oddly enough, by 
pretty weather, Bovina Lions Club 
members sold $651 worth of brooms, 
mops and other merchandise during 
the annual broom sale which was 
conducted Friday. 

Dick Horn, Bovina Mustang 

quarterback, was named a member 
of the All-District 3-B first team. 

J.N. Shaw of Gainesville died 
Monday afternoon. He was the 
father of Mrs. E.H. Moody of 
Bovina. 

Parmer and other counties in this 
vicinity followed the West Texas 
trend in increasing population, 
non-farm employment and factory 
jobs in 1956. 

Many farmers hopped on the 
sesame band wagon this year, as 
they continued their search for new 
and more profitable field crops. 

+ + + + 
15 YEARS AGO—NOV. 21, 1962 

Bovina Church of Christ will 
observe formal opening of the new 
building Sunday afternoon. An-
nouncement of the special activities 
was made this week by Don Stone, 
minister of the church. Some 400 
people are expected to attend. 

Wintertime, 1962-63 version, un-
reeled its most severe blast of the 
season here over the weekend and 
into this week. The snow was 
estimated at two inches. 

Two men, Julian Hernandez, 32, 
Bovina, and Paul Gene Graham, 23, 
South Prince Street, Clovis, were 
killed in a head-on crash early 
Saturday morning on U.S. Highway 
60, three and one-half miles 
northeast of Farwell. 

The Running Water Draw Water-
shed project cleared a legal hurdle 
in Parmer County on Tuesday when 

Courthouse 
Notes 

MARAAAWANIASAARANI 

Instrument Report Ending Novem-
ber 2, 1977 in County Clerk Office, 
Bonnie Warren, County Clerk 

WD, Farwell Clinic Inc., Farwell 
Hospital Dist., 300 ft. N Ave. C, on E 
5th St., Farwell 

WD, Gary Martin, Juan Jimenez, 
lot 6, Blk. 28, Friona 

WD, Lewis B. Riley, Woodrow 
Reed, E 155 ac. Sec. 4, T1N;R3E E 
83.41 ac. Sec. 2, Harding 

WD, Nancy Kay Hodges, Gary 
Dale Hodges, part Sec. 32, T3S;R3E 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 
Dean Austin Harkey and Marilyn 

Kay Jones. 
Robert Alexander and Christine 

Faye Bails. 
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Contest Standings 
4b 

113 
Allen Cumpton 

111 
Jeanne Kerby, Joel Nelson 

109 
Dixie Carson, Donna Grissom, 

Donna Malcom of Tulia, Jacque 
Nabers, Emmett Tabor, Billy 
Whitecotton 

108 
Leon Grissom, Pat Read 

107 
Mike Grissom, Manuel Hernan- 

dez, Jr., Ronnie D. Wines 
106 

T.W. Carpenter of Clovis, Frances 
DAVID STEELMAN 

FFA Member Of The Week 

Johnson, Johnny Martinez, Sand*: 
Ware  

105 
John Curtis, Mike Nabers, Mona: 

Smith, George Villarreal, A.S.: 
Wilson 

104 
Hattie Burnett, Ron Cain of: 

Friona, Greg Hromas, Joyce Read,: 
Patsy Sherrill, Mary Jane Wilson.,:-

103 
Bobby Cumpton, Dorothy Harris::: 

102 	 -.*•• 
Mary Hernandez, Jim Noyes;' 

Kent Stanberry, Tom Ware, Joe P4 
Wright 	 • 

101 
Janice Carpenter of Clovis, Joai: 

Carson, Donald Dale, Danny Hatt,: 
Erith Hawkins, Eddie Villarreal 

100 
Opal Wines 
	.•••4ste  

99 	 Seas. 

Gay Horn, Janie Sudderth 

eel Pe4)4a*41.110041610enie4  Sin( al( )0 

FFA News 	I 
97 

Bruce Caldwell, Brenda GriggSli- 
Fume Harris, Monty Malcom itt 
Canyon, Buford Stanberry 

96 

:tag,  

Gilllland
a  

By JIM RHODES 
David Steelman has been selected 

as the Bovina FFA Member of the 
Week. David is currently serving as 
our vice president. 

David raises and shows pigs for 
his productive enterprises. Last 
year, David showed two Berkshire 
pigs for his project. In the shop, 
David is building some metal panels 
to be used on the Ag Farm. 

Mike Read, Steve Cockerham, Mr. 
Barrett and Mr. Widner traveled to 
Chickasaw where they purchased 
several good pigs at the sale. 

The Greenhand Chapter Conduct-
ing team, consisting of Dale Turner, 
president; Nathaniel Shepherd, vice 
president; Tim Garner, secretary; 
Gabriel Guevaia, treasurer; Mi-
chael Nance, sentinel; Richard 
Lowe, advisor; Kevin Hughes, Joe 
Rodriquez, and Don Lane, mem-
bers, placed sixth in the district 
competition. 

;;4. 

Jody Stanberry 
95 

Dana Harris 
94 

Laura Bartlett, Wayne 
Kyle Harris, Mike Read 

93 
Houston Bartlett, Pamela Stait 

berry, Johnny Villarreal 
92 

Darrell Barlow, Jay Be Barred, 
Beverly Harris, Carl Rea 

91 

The Farm Radio Team ended up 
in second place with 914 points, 
behind Friona, who had 918 points. 

The members of this team were 
Scott Johnson, Ricky Mayfield, and 
Eddie Garcia. 

We would like to say thanks to 
these teams for such a good showing 
at the district contest. 

The Bovina Blade 
PublishedEvery Wednesday 

at 100 3rd St. 
Bovina, Texas 79009 

Second Class Postage Paid at 
Bovina, Texas 79009 

Subscription Rates—Parmer & Ad- 
joining Counties, $4.50 per year. 
Outside area, $6.30 per year. 

all Ellis, Publisher 
Richard Jones, Editor 
Scooter Russell, Bookkeeper 

Bobby Johnson, Flossie Rhine.; 
hart, Hugh Rogers, Danny Stan 
berry, Dean Stanberry, Brat 
Whitney 

•.;-• • •• 
Deat 

the commissioners court tentatively 
agreed to act as co-sponsor of the 
project. 

Superior Electric Co. was moved 
to a new location. The business is 
now housed in building formerly 
occupied by Combs Grocery on Main 
Street. 

-1- -I- 	+ 
10 YEARS AGO—NOV. 22,1987 

Bids from three contractors were 
opened here Friday for the proposed 
Bovina Medical Clinic before 
members of the building committee, 
temporary executive committee and 
James W. Depperman of Sears-Roe-
buck Foundation. 

Kenneth Howard of Denton will 
begin work here Tuesday of next 
week as combination man-in-charge 
of Bovina for General Telephone 
Company. 

Postmaster Gene Ezell today 
urged citizens of Bovina to be sure to 
use the correct address on their 
letters and packages going to 
servicemen overseas to avoid 
serious delays in delivery. 

Seaman Recruit Glendol W. 
Davies, USN, son of Mrs. Mildred M. 
Davies, Bovina, has been graduated 
from nine weeks of Navy basic 
training at the Great Lakes Naval 
Training Center. 

The Teenage Club continues to 
send The Bovina Blade to Bovina 
boys who are serving in the Armed 
Forces in Vietnam. 

+ + + + 
5 YEARS AGO—NOV. 22, 1972 

Mustang Mentor Roger Ezell sat 
in his office at Williford Gym 
Monday, reminisced about the just 
past football season, his first as head 
coach, and looked forward to the 
future. 

Mrs. Eldon Thatcher of 905 
Ridgelea Drive and her niece, Toby 
Bandy of Bovina, narrowly escaped 
serious injury about 7 p.m. last night 
when their car struck a double-deck 
cattle truck at the intersection of 
Highway 86 and FM 1731. 

Mrs. A.L. Kerby, treasurer of the 
Bovina Booster Club, reported the 
organization had spent approxi-
mately $1540 on new equipment 
since school began. 

Mrs. Ben C. Rejino of Bovina, a 
member of St. Ann's Catholic 
Church here, was named Woman of 
the Year Tuesday night of last week 
at the Amarillo Diocese Council of 

—Catholic Women convention at 
Christ the King Catholic Church in 
Lubbock. 

90 
Ken Horn, Doug Johnson, 

Wines 

101110111110111101"0111. 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

Calendar 
Of Events 
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OPEN 24 
HOURS 

STOCK-UP 
BEFORE THE 

HOLIDAY 
RUSH! 

MIMES GOOD 
NOVEMBER 
24-27,1077 
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WEEK OF NOV. 24-30 
Thursday, November 24 
Thanksgiving Day. 
Monday, November 28 

The civic clubs scheduled 
to meet in Hobo's Restau-
rant apparently will not 
meet. None of the organiza-
tions have notified The 
Blade of a change in dates or 
a meeting place. The 
restaurant is now closed. OPEN THANKSGIVING DAY 

WE ARE OPEN FOR YOUR SHOPPING CONVENIENCE! 

By Ace Reid 
QUARTERS
BORDEN'S 

OLEO 

4 

AE 
PEPSI 
COLA 

32 OZ. $ 1 29 
PACK 

PLUS DEPOSIT 

Thursday-Friday, Nov. 24-25 
School holidays. 
Monday, November 28 

Begins second quarter. 
Seventh and eighth grade 

junior high girls basketball 
at Kress. Game time, 5 p.m. 
Four games. 

Tuesday, November 29 
High school basketball. 

Tulia at Bovina. Game time, 
4 p.m. Four games. 

FFA District Banquet in 
Muleshoe, 6:30 p.m. 

Wednesday, November 30 
High School report cards 

to be given out during the 
fifth period. 

At its regular monthly 
meeting, Thursday, No-
vember 17, at 7:30 p.m. the 
volunteer Board of Direc-
tors of the Parmer County 
Services Center at Bovina 
met in a session not 
constituting a quorum and 
were able to hear reports 
only. 
The Center monthly re-

port given by Pearl Cervan-
tez revealed five new 
families assisted, thirty 
contacts and referrals, 
twelve mobile and resources 
and eleven external con-
tacts for the month of 
October. 
Reported also was pro-

gress of on-going programs 
of homemakers, rent sub-
sidy, medical transportation 
and Green Thumb. It was 
noted that Emilina Martinez 
was hired to fill the Bovina 
position of Green Thumb. 
Still vacant are positions in 
Farwell and Friona. 

Discussed under new 
business were the empty 
Stocking Fund and emer-
gency assistance problems 
where the Board has an 
emergency situation that no 
program will fill but does 
not have the funds on 
resources to respond to. 

Tabled until the Decem-
ber meeting was the area 
Board meeting report, Bo-
ard member resignations 
and terminations and the 
contacts of new volunteers. 

)\ 
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FACTS 
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FIRST STATE BANK PRESENTS: 
COW POKES 
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"Wal, he wasn't much of a salesman anyhow!" 
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Well, someone finally is 
trying to do something about 
the weather. Not change it, 
mind you, but at least trying 
to give the farmer and ranch-
er a fighting chance to keep 
up with it. A national 
agricultural weather network 
is being set up, using the 
states' Extension Service per-
sonnel, who will practically 
hand carry weather infor-
mation direct to the farm or 
ranch. The National Weather 
Service (NWS), Washington. 
D.C., is expected to get the 
weather information down to 
the grass roots level faster 
and more accurately than 
ever before. NWS also plans 
to set up 330 special weather 
radio stations to broadcast ag 
weather advisories. The 
whole radio network should 
be in operation within 3.4 
years. not a minute too soon 
for most farmers either. 

124.119\  
Nais  

BOVINA, TEXAS 
201 3rd St. *um EQUIPMENT* 

411/ Mabry, Dab 71<t-4441  

FIRST STATE BANK 
Member, FDIC OF BOVINA 	115 3rd St. 



BOVINA BUSINESSES 1977 

F. tb 
c 

  

nt 

 

st 

  

  

    

YOU MAY WIN PRIZES OF 
$750_ $500 $300 EACH WEEK  

PLUS THE 

GRAND PRIZE 

$100
00  

In Cash PERSONAL 
FOUL 

Bovina Businesses Football Contest 
ENTRY BLANK 

	

Contestant's Name 	  

	

Address 	  

Tiebreaker pick Score)HOUSTON K. CITY 
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Turn This Blank Into The Blade Office By 5 p.m. Friday 

BIG NICK 
FARM MACHINERY 

WE * BUY * SELL * TRADE 
"IF1 HAVEN'T GOT IT, I'LL GET IT! " 

ALL TYPES OF IMPLEMENTS 
COMPLETE AUCTION SERVICE 

PHONE (806)238-1614 
HIGHWAY 60 BOVINA, TEXAS 

8 
	

PENN STATE AT PITTSBURGH 

,k-AiMpidim 
.4.111111h 
00111111iR. ...q,P• 
.0 
'.1.- • ,' 

HWY. 

9 

Lawlis Gin Co. 
. 	For 

Better Turnout 
And 

1  Better Sample 

- GIN WITH 
OVID LA wus 

86 EAST 	- 	PH.238-1513 

TEXAS AT TEXAS A&M 

HORN 
z,:( 7,;=, 7-7— 	INDEPENDENT 

INS 
A GENCY 

URANCE 

COMPLETE 
AGENCY 

* FARM * HOME 
* CROP 

KEN HORN 
238-1214 

AT LSU 

* LIFE * HEALTH 

* MHO 

MINA HORN 
PHONE 

10 	WYOMING 

PAUL JONES 
TEXACO 

TEXACO 	PAUL and OLA LEE ,. 

CATERING 

Miff 

11 

DAIRY 
TO 

INSIDE 
A Y so 

FREEZE 
HARVES T ORDERS • 

DINING 
!CALL 238-1460 
AT DENVER BALTIMORE 

p am et 	county 
lng Se 

SVal" 	-
r 

 v i
vy• 

ce 
HEADQUARTERS ON 

FM ROAD 	2290 
WEST OF BOVINA Ph. 115-4990 

12 	LOS ANGELES AT CLEVELAND 

BONDS OIL CO. 

'DISTRIBUTOR 

TOMMY BONDS 

HWY. 60 

PH. 238-1146 

AT SAN FRANCISCO 

C
GULF 

4111111k  Gulf I 
1111, 

13 	NEW ORLEANS 

AGRI-SPRAYERS. 
INC. 

BOX 66 • BOVINA, TEXAS 79009 
GA YLON RHODES 

BUSINESS 	HOME 
806/238-1475 806/238-1572.  

14 	DALLAS AT WASHINGTON 
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ALL YOU HAVE TO DO, IS PICK THE WINNERS 

--- THERE'S NOTHING TO BUY! 

BOVINA BUSINESSES 
FOOTBALL CONTEST 

HONOR ROLL 

BOVINA PUMP CO. 
AMERICAN 

TURBINE CO. 

DEEP WELL 
TURBINE PUMPS 
1 	PETERSBURG VS SUNRAY 

BACKING 

THE 
BOVINA 
2 	LITTLEFIELD VS 

MUSTANGS! 

1 

THE 

BLADE 
CHILDRESS 

,qiNIIMIII 
may, 

4111144, - 9 

SHERLEY GRAIN CO. 
" Serving Parmer County Farmers 

The Year 'Round" 

Phone 238-1521 

Bovina 	4111 

-41111111k  

3 	PERRYTON VS BROWNWOOD 

PHILLIPS 	CHARLES 
66 	OIL CO. 

Phone 238-1284 
-Phillips 66 

*Tires 
*Batteries 

*Accessories 

4 	UCLA VS SOUTHERN CAL 7  

CHUCK'S SPRAYING SERV. INC. 

d: 	jv 
AERIAL SPRAYING 	DEFOLIATING 	FERTILIZING 

SEEDING 	HERBICIDES 
RADIO DISPATCHED FOR PROMPT SERVICE 

BOVINA 

DIAL 238-1331 

5 	ARMY VS NAVY 

HOBO'S 
FRIED CHICKEN 

FEATURING 
* STEAKS 	* MEXICAN FOOD 

* ITALIAN FOOD * DAILY SPECIALS 
TAKE - OUT - ORDERS 

Mondays Thru Thurs 6:.30 a.m. - 8 p.m. 
Friday & Saturdays 6:.30 a.m. -10 p.m. 

Sundays 9 a.m. Thru .3p.m. 

6 	
GEORGIA AT GEORGIA TECH 

giret State CBartk 
OF BOVINA 

MEMBER, FDIC 

BOVINA 
WHEAT GROWERS, INC. 

BOVINA & RHEA 
SO. ILLINOIS AT WTSU 

CONTEST RULES: 
1. There are 14 football games listed In ads on this page. 
2. Pick the team you think will win in each game and place 
the WINNER'S NAME beside the corresponding number in 
the contest entry blank at bottom of this page.  
3. Pick the score of the tie breaker game and place your 
guess in the appropriate blanks on the entry. The tie 
breaker game will not count on your won-lost record. It will 
be used only in case of a tie. 
4. Winners will be named by the Monday following the 
contest deadline each Friday and they will be named by 
Sunday, if possible. Cash prizes of $7.50 for first, 85.00 for 
second, and third prize of $3.00 will be awarded. 
5. Tabulations of individual entrants will be kept all season 
and at the end of the season Grand prize winner will be 
named. 
6. There is nothing to buy. No requirements other than to 
bring the entry blank, filled out, to The Blade office by 5 
p.m. or postmarked by 5 p.m. Friday. 
7. Only one entry blank may be submitted per Individual. If 
more than one blank is submitted by an individual, all will 
be disqualified. 
8. Tabulations will be available for public Inspection. 
Members of Blade staff will serve as Judges for contest. 
9. Contestants must be 10 years old or older. 
10. Everyone, except employees of this newspaper and 
their families, Is eligible to enter. 

1960-NEIL SMITH 	1972-
1961-ER1TH HAWKINS GARY McCORMICK 
1962-EMMETT TABOR 	1973- 
1963-PAUL JONES 	HARRY J. CHARLES 
1964-JEANNE KERBY 	1974-
1965-ALLEN CUMPTON EMMETT TABOR 
1966-TRUCK LUSK 	1975- 
1967-LEROY LANCE 	A.M. WILSON 
1968-BILL ROBERTS 	1976-
1969-LARRY WARDLAW GREG HROMAS 
1970-DONNA CRISWELL 
1971 TED GRAHAM 



NOW OPEN FOR BUSINESS 

FL WER 
509 Main Street 	Phone 247-3996 

FRIONA, TEXAS 
"For Loving, Caring, Sharing, Comforting, Decorating, 

Entertaining, Celebrating ... FLOWERS DO IT" 

*Fresh Flowers * Green Plants * Pot Plants 

*Artificial Arrangements * We Service Funerals & Weddings 

* We Wire Flowers (AFS) 

Watch For Our Grand Opening & 
Xmas Open House ... Friday, Dec. 2 

* LAURA HART 	* JOHNNY MASSEY 

*HOLLY CAMPBELL * KARENE BASS 

1411(1011OT OteCtikitt-3141331 

11111111T1 lick Word -147-4171 

FIIONA S. 0. Nat - 741.3311 

SPRINKLER 
SERVICE 

Division of BIG T PUMP CO. 

WINTER CHECK-UP 
FOR YOUR CARS, PICK-UPS 
& TRACTORS 

Let Us Check Your ..... 
Anti-Freeze 
Fan Belts 
Hoses 
Transmission Fluid 
Brakes 
Shocks 
Exhaust 

SPECIAL.... 
For A Limited Time We're Offering A Special Low 

Price On Tune-Ups, Brakes And Exhaust Work. 

FRIONA ENGINE 
& DIESEL REPAIR 

1008 WASHINGTON 	PHONE 247-2267 
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Hospital Report Church News Fi 

ADMISSIONS— 
Annie Scott, Friona; Bengino 

Medrano, Hereford; Mary Madrid, 
Friona; Donald Phelps, Friona; 
Stella Marquez, Hereford; John 
(arson, Friona; Ezra Burton, 
Broadview, N.M.; Dana Auburg, 

Friona; Jeremiah Saiz, Friona; 
C.H. Jefferson, Bovina; Oralia 
Sierra and baby girl, Friona; Aaron 
Weatherly, Friona; Howard H. 
Kelso, Bovina; Sandra Awtrey and 
baby boy, Friona; and Daniel 
Pesina, Hereford. 

The Bovina Variety Club met on 
Nov. 12 at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Wesley Rice, where a turkey dinner 
with all the trimmings was enjoyed. 

Attending were Mr. and Mrs. H.H. 
Kelso, Mr. and Mrs. Fred O'Hair, 
Mr. and Mrs. O.H. Jones, Irma 
Bradshaw, Charlsie Eubank, Ruby 
Jones, Mr. and Mrs. L.M. Grissom, 
Lola Grissom, G.A. Bandy, Louise 
Douglas and Monty Turner. 

DISMISSALS— 
Ronald Smiley, Ronald Mayfield, 

Annabelle Cepeda and baby girl, 
Annie Scott, Nora Edens, Conchita 
Woolsey, Mary Madrid, Bengino 
Medrano, Donald Phelps, Diana 
Guzman and baby boy, Jeremiah 
Saiz, W.D. Buske, Jerry Atchley, 
Bertie Doak, Diana Compean, 
Estella Marquez, C.H. Jefferson, 
Dana Auburg, John Carson, Shawn 
Wikle, Aaron Weatherly, Howard H. 
Kelso, Daniel Pesina and Oralia 
Sierra and baby girl. 

our silver ware in the kitchen. 
Please, if you wish to help, bring , 
your tapes to the church. Place them' 
in an envelope well marked on the' 
outside.--The U.M.W. 

Thanks to those who installed the 

new church signs. Have you seen 
them? 

To the Choir: Your message in -. 
music at the funeral service for our 
loved one is gratefully acknow—v: 
!edged and deeply appreciated.—
Grace Ivy.  

0,1  

ST. ANN" CATHOLIC CHURCH ; 
Masses at Bovina: Sunday 

morning, 8:30. Wednesday, Eucha- 
ristic service, 7 p.m. 	

:2 

Masses at Friona: Saturday 
evening at 7; Sunday morning at 
10:30. Wednesday, Eucharistic ser-,,, 
vice, 8 p.m. 

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Memorials were given this week in 

remembrance of Henry Ivy by Mr. 
and Mrs. R.G. Barron, Mr. and Mrs. 
Durward Bell, Mr. and Mrs. L.M. 
Grissom, Mr. and Mrs. J.T. 
Hammonds, Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Hastings, Mr. and Mrs. W.M. 
Sudderth, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Willard, Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Richards, Mr. and Mrs. C.F. 
Hastings, Mr. and Mrs. Otto 
Gilliland, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Prather and Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Prather. 

Congratulations to Mr. and Mrs. 
Wallace Price on the birth of a 
grandson, Jeremian Honve. The 
Prices already have a granddaugh-
ter. 

Happy Birthdays: Nov. 17, 
Kimberly Kirkpatrick, Mrs. T.J. 
Hopingardner; 18, Debbie Gober 
Schilling; 19, Scott Gober. 

The United Methodist Women are 
saving grocery tapes to supplement 

published, is dedicated to her 
parents, Jim and Rose Roberts. 
Many friends and well-wishers 
attended the event. 

CPR Clinics 
Scheduled 
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Confessions: Bovina, Penitential ,„ 
Rite, second Saturday of month, 8:30 
p.m. 

Baptisms every first Sunday of 
month. 

New series of instructions start 
every first Sunday of month at 80  
p.m. 

Servers for Nov. 27: Tommy;; 
Mesman, Teddy Mesman, Bernie 
Mesman. 

Communion distributors for Nov. 
27: Phil Brockman, Zeferino fr  
Villarreal. 

Holy Family Parish of Nazareth 
cordially invites you to their 
Thanksgiving Dance on Friday, 
Nov. 25, from 9 p.m. to 1 a.m. Music:-: 
by Tiny Lynn. Homemade sausage 
and sweet rolls will be served; 
throughout the dance. 

Thought for the Day....The three 
essentials of happiness are: Someli  
thing to do, something to love,.o, 
something to hope for. 

ALMA CLAYTON....Bovina author, 
was honored at an autograph coffee 
last Thursday morning in the 
Community Room of the First State 
Bank. Mrs. Clayton's book, recently 

Youths Attend 
4-H Food Show 

Parmer County had six represen-
tatives at the District 2 4-H Food 
Show, November 12 at the Texas 
Tech University Center Ballroom in 
Lubbock. 

This year's theme was "Conser-
vation Cooks" with each entrant 
stressing a method of energy 
conservation in preparing their dish. 

Lawlises 
Have Girl 

Dud1e 

FIE 

Parmer County representatives 
were: Junior Division, Maureen 
Jesko, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Jesko of Lazbuddie, red ribbon 
in side dish; Devera Rhodes, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Gaylon 
Rhodes, of Bovina, blue ribbon in 
snacks and beverages; Frank Jesko, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Pete Jesko of 
Lazbuddie, blue ribbon in breads 

Mr. and Mrs. James Lawlis of San?, 
Antonio, announce the birth, on Nov.;; 
17, of their second child, a daughter, 
Jodi Miranda, She weighed eight 
pounds, three and three-quartero: 
ounces and was 20% inches long. 

Jodi has a sister, Jane Michele, 
years old, who shares the unusual:: 
distinction of having been born one 
the same date, Nov. 17. 

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Lloyd and Mr. and Mrs. Ovid 
Lawlis of Bovina. 

A series of four CPR clinics are 
scheduled in Parmer County. 

Cardiopulmonary Resuscitation 
(CPR) is the method used to help 
a person who's breathing and-or 
heart has stopped. 

The sessions will be on a Sunday 
afternoon from 2 to 5 o'clock, 
beginning January 22 in Bovina; 
Jan. 29, Friona; Feb. 5, Lazbuddie; 
Feb. 12, Farwell. Meeting places 
and definite dates will be announced 
later. 

The new "Pulse of Life" film will 
be shown and instructions will teach 
the proper rate and ratio to perform 
a one- and two-man rescue. Life-size 
mannequins will be available for 
practice. 

Certification class will then be 
held in each community. To be 
certified, for one year, two 4-hour 
classes are taught and a written 
examination and skills test is 
required. 

For more information, the 
following persons may be contacted: 

Arlene McCullum, Bovina, 225-
6411; Joe Buchanan, Friona, 
265-3444; Joyce McGehee, Lazbud-
die, 965-2252; or Doris Sides, 
Farwell, 825-3500. 

and desserts; and Wendy Jarman, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Gene Paul 
Jarman of Lazbuddie, blue ribbon in 
breads and desserts. 

Senior division contestants were 
Johanna Mesman, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ben Mesman of Farwell, 
red ribbon in snacks and beverages, 
and Joan Carson, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Marion Carson of Bovina, 
red ribbon in breads and desserts. 

Contestants were judged accord-
ing to leadership roles in 9-H, Food 
Preparation, completeness of days 
menu and quality of dish prepared. 

All programs and information of 
the Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service are available to everyone 
without regard to race, color, 
religion, sex, age, or national origin. 
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Lindsay's Zlmmatic Crop Lease is a revolutionary leasing 
program. if you don't take a long, hard look at it, you'll be 
shortchanging yourself. The Zimmatic Crop Lease is unique 
In the Industry. When you study this offer you'll see that 
Lindsay is ready to go the distance with you and share some of 
the same risks you face every year. 

Whether y ou raise corn, alfalfa, wheat(  sugar beets, potatoes, 
soybeans or whatever, the Zimmatic Crop Lease can work for 
you. Although the lease payment is based on the changing 
price of corn, Lindsay designed the program considering that 
over the long-term other crop prices generally fluctuate with 
corn. 

Come in and see us soon. When we put a pencil to this 
program, you'll see that no other center pi% ot irrigation 
company has a finance program that can compete with the 
Zimmatic Crop Lease. 

Consider the features of the Zlmmatic Crop Lease. First of all, 
If corn prices plunge, so does your lease payment. But also 
consider the low security deposit [lowest In the industry] and 
the fact that it's a 12-year lease [longest In the 
Industry]...both features Improve your cash flow each year of 
the lease. Your Zimmatic is out there raising your first year's 
crop before your first payment Is due.And you'll be getting an 
annual Interest payment on your security deposit to use as 
you wish. lataftimit  

Bo 
• 

Term: 
Payment: 

Security Deposit: 
Rate: 

Option: 

12 years 
Arrears 
5% of equipment cost 
Depends on corn price 
Conversion to standard 
10-year lease 



FIRST 
BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

of BOVINA 
Sunday: 

Sunday School-9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Training Union-6 p.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. Rev. Derrel Lewis 

PLEASANT HILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Pleasant Hill, N.M. 
Sunday: 

Sunday School-10: 30 a.m. 
Texas Time; 

Morning Worship, 11:30 
a.m. Texas Time; 

MISSION 
BELEN BAUTISTA 

Escuela Dominical-9: 45 a.m. 
Mensaje-11: 30 a.m.-Union De 
Pre Preparaciou-5 p.m. Mier- 
eoles Estudlo De La Biblia-7: 30 p.m. 

BOVINA 
PENTECOSTAL 

HOLINESS CHURCH 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

BOVINA 
CHURCH 
of CHRIST 

SUNDAY SERVICES 
Classes-9: 45 a.m. 
Worship-10: 45 a.m. and 6 p.m. 
WEDNESDAY 
Devotional and Classes-9 p.m. 

OKLAHOMA 
LANE 

BAPTIST 
CHURCH 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. 

BOVINA 
METHODIST 

CHURCH 
Sunday School-9: 45 a.m. 
Moening Worship-11 a.m. 
M.Y.F.-6 p.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 
Choir Practice-
Wednesday-8 p.m. 

Rev. James W. Putnam 

Rev. Moody Smith 

OKLAHOMA 
LANE 

METHODIST 
CHURCH 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 	 4412. 

Rev. H.L. Whittenburg 

Cecil Bunch 

Church Page Sporisors 
.dmormmilima 	 7  

HOBO'S CHICKEN 
• &STEAKHOUSE 

DUDLEY'S AUTO 
PARTS. 3rd & Dimplitt 

Highway 
Dudley & Jane Hughes 	 Ph.238-1219 

FIRST STATE BANK 
Of Bovina 

MEMBER FDIC 

LAWLIS GIN 
COMPANY 

_Highway , 86  

BONDS OIL 
COMPANY- 

Gulf Distributor 

PARMER COUNTY 
SPRAYING SERVICE 

,Ph. Tharp 225-4990 	Larry Gregory 

:AGRI-SPRAYERS. INC .  
QualityAerial Spraying 

Ph. 238-1475 

KERBY 
WELDING SERVICE 

AI I Deal The Year 0 

PAUL JONES 
TEXACO 

• Fiiestone Tires 

FRIONA MOTORS 
"Your Parmer County Ford Dealer" 

Bovina 	Ph. 238-1395 

.PARMER COUNTY 
IMPLEMENT COMPANY 

W Hwy. 60 Friona, Tex Ph. 247-2721' 

DON'S MEDICINE CHEST 
Prescription & Health Needs 

Ph. 238-1659 

BOVINA GIN COMPANY 
"Your Satisfaction Is 

Our First Concern" 

HORN INSURANCE 
ALL TYPES OF 
INS URANCT 

* Tires * Batteries * Accessories 
CHARLES 

OIL COMPANY 
ALLS UP'S 

CONVENIENCE STORE 
201 - 3rd Street 	365 Days A Year 

Oklahoma Lane 
FARM SUPPLY & GIN 

Phone 225-4116'  

GATEWAY FARMS 
BOVINA, TEXAS 

SOUTHSIDE 
MOTOR SUPPLY 

Dimmitt Road 	Phone 238-1427  

BOVINA PUMP CO. 
Highway 86 - West 

SHERRILL 
LUMBER COMPANY 

Highway 60 - Bovina 

BOVINA BLADE 
Bill EIls, publisher 

REEVE CHEVROLET -OLDS 
"Your Transportation Counselors 

Since 1938" 

SHERLEY GRAIN COMPANY 
"Serving Parmer County Farmers 

The Year Around" 

WEDNESDAY Prayer Meeting-8 p.m. 

Rev. Ricky Parker 
Church Training, 7 p.m. Texas Time; Wednesday Night 
Evening Worship, 8 p.m. Texas Time; Meeting-8 p.m. 

Church Chuckles by CARTWRIGHT 

. . furthermore, I pledge not to stay up any- 
more for the Saturday Nite Late Late Shows!' " 

...1 

MY LUCKY 

DAY 
"....this is the day which 

the Lord hath made; we 
will rejoice and be glad in 
it" (Psalms 118: 24). 

Garland Chapman, 
principal of Robert E. Lee 
High School in Midland, 
Texas, relates an experi-
ence during his days as a 
grade school principal. A 
little boy in the second 
grade started the morning 
by falling and hitting his 
head on the concrete—re-
quired three stitches to 
close the gash! Recess 
proved unfortunate as he 
and another boy ran 
together and two teeth 
were loosened. During the 
afternoon he fell and 
broke his arm. Mr. 
Chapman decided to take 
the boy home immediate-
ly before anything else 
happened. They were 
riding toward the boy's 
home when the principal 
noticed the little guy 
clutching something in his 

hand. "What do you 
have?" the principal 
asked. "A quarter" an-
swered the boy. "Where 
did you get it?" Mr. 
Chapman asked. "I found 
it on the playground 
today," explained the 
little guy. Then he smiled 
and with an excited voice 
exclaimed, "You know, 
Mr. Chapman, I've never 
found a quarter before. 
This is my LUCKY 
DAY! !" 

So much Is xlependent 
not on how the day looks 
at us--but how we look at 
the day. Every day has its 
problems but faith can 
turn them into blessings. 
Each beautiful butterfly 
looks rather uneventful at 
the- beginning—but what a 
change the day makes. 

Cecil F. Bunch 
Minister 

Church of Christ 

ST. JOHN 
LUTHERAN 
CHURCH 

Sunday School-9: 30 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10: 30 a.m. 

Rev. Herman Schelter 

ST. ANN'S 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Mass—Sunday, 8: 30 a.m. 
CCD—After Mass Sunday 

Confession: Sunday, 8-8: 25 a.m. 
Rev. Dermot O'Brien, 

Administrator 
Zeferino Villarreal, Deacon 

238-1404 

THE BOVINA BLADE, WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 23, 1977, PAGE 5 

MBP Gets Contract 
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MBPXL Corporation, the nation's 
second largest beef processor, has 
entered into a contract with a 
subsidiary of Keystone Foods 
Corporation, McDonald's largest 
supplier, to slaughter and fabricate 
more than 300,000 cattle over the 
next three years. 

Keystone Foods Corporation and 
MBPXL Corporation are just 
concluding a previous contractual 
relationship. Under that tria' 
contract, MBPXL slaughtered anc 
fabricated 50,000 cattle for Keystone 
over a period of a year. This 
innovative arrangement contributed 
to a stabilization of MBPXL's 
production volume and earnings. 

The new contract will increase 
gradually the number of cattle per 
week from one thousand to 
twenty-five hundred. 

Fabrication is the removal of fat 
and bone, the separation of the 
carcass into various cuts and the 
boxing of these cuts. 

Keystone, the world's largest 
frozen hamburger producer, 
supplies patties to 43 per cent of 
McDonald's restaurants. In its last 
fiscal year, Keystone reported sales 
of $162,000,000. 
MBPXL, with annual sales of just  

under one billion dollars, slaughters 
cattle and fabricates carcasses at 
plants in Texas, Kansas and 
Missouri. 

JVs Split 
In Openers 

The first basketball games of the 
season, played at Muleshoe on 
Tuesday, Nov. 15, were something of 
a disappointment as the Bovina JV 
Girls recorded the only victory of the 
four contests. 

There were bright spots, of course, 
Kathy Williams led her team with 13 
points as the JV Girls won their 
game, 33-24, and James Shepherd 
collected 11 tallies during a 49-34 JV 
Boys loss. 

+ 
JUNIOR VARSITY GIRLS 

Muleshoe 	7 11 16 24 
Bovina 	10 24 29 33 

Kathy Williams, 13. 
JUNIOR VARSITY BOYS 

Muleshoe 	14 32 46 49 
Bovina 	5 11 19 34 

James Shepherd, 11. 

motrvirtimiwift• 
SCHOOL 
LUNCH 
MENU 

11"1111401604016040004/ 

WEEK OF NOV. 28-DEC. 2 
MONDAY—Lasagne, blackeyed 

peas, lettuce and tomato salad, 
orange juice, buttered toast, 
chocolate cake, milk, 

TUESDAY—Hot dogs with chili, 
French fries, oatmeal cookies, 
sliced pineapple, milk. 

WEDNESDAY—Chicken fried 
steak, gravy, creamed potatoes, 
English peas, hot rolls, butter, pear 
halves, milk. 

THURSDAY—Hamburgers, let-
tuce and tomatoes, onions, pickles, 
mustard, potato chips, brownies, 
peach halves, milk. 

FRIDAY—Fish and tarter sauce, 
scalloped potatoes, green beans, hot 
rolls, butter, chocolate pudding with 
topping, milk. 

WANTED....A good used 
piano. Call 225-6895. 20-tfnc 

Recipes Sought 
Recipes from Parmer County 

residents are still being sought for 
the county cookbook being planned 
by the Friona Friends of the 
Library. 

Recipes submitted will bear the 
name of the persons sending them 
in, and proceeds from the sale of the 
cookbook will be used for the 
Library Building Fund. 

Volunteers are also sought from 
among county artists for illustra-
tions heading each section. Any 
artist interested is asked to call Mrs. 
Jan Turner, Rt. 1, Friona, 265-3879. 

Response has been good in the 
Friona area, but there have been 
few recipes sent in from other towns 
and communities in Parmer County. 
Any recipe will be suitable, and as 
many as anyone wants to submit is 
welcome. Please include name and 
address with recipes and send to 
Mrs. Jan Turner, Rt. 1, Box 17, 
Friona, Tx. 79035. Telephone 
265-3879. 
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Bovina Churches Welcome You! 
rj 



CITY BODY SHOP 
* Air Conditioner Service 

* Repairs to Tractors & Combines 

CITY BODY SHOP 
Friona, Texas 

Phone 247-3372 	 uric 

Ohte 

CI MI 0 

it FIRST 
%FEDERAL::: 

FIRST FEDERAL 
SAVINGS 

leUHROLMING 
LENDER 

801 Pile St. 

7 62- 4 41 7 

Clovis, New Mexico 
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6 0 CIASSINS Wilkinson Services 
Here Wednesday 

Rites Tuesday For 
Steven Walling 

1 Ph. 2381523 
Word Ads, first insertion, per word 8 cents 
Additional insertions (no copy change), per 
word..'. 	 6 cents 
Minimum charge 	 $1.25 -- 

A.B. Wilkinson, 83, of Bovina, died 
Sunday. 

Services were held yesterday 
(Wednesday) in the First Baptist 
Church with the Rev. Jimmy I 

Classified display (boxed ads) 1 column or 
2 column width. Per column inch 	$1.25 
Cards of Thanks—same as classified word 
rate, minimum charge 	$1.25 

Junction. He had been working there 
for two months. 

Surviving besides his father are 
his mother, Lou Luhrs of Santa 
Monica, Calif.; two sisters, Rebecca 
and Donna, both of Hereford; two 
brothers, Hayden of Bovina and 
Shane, of Grand Junction, Colo.; and 
his grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jesse Walling of Bovina. 

THE LEGACY 
COLLECTION 

1424 Pile Street—Clovis 
Furniture, Glassware 

Light Fixtures 
10 a.m.-4 p.m. MST 
Phone (505) 763-6402 

Weekends by Appoint!  
ment. 	 184tc 

3= 	3r 	---x T" 

DEADLINE for classified advertising in 
Wednesday's issue—Noon Tuesday. Billingsley 

Rites Held Check advertisement and report any 
error immediately; The Blade is not 
responsible for error after ad has already 
nut once. 

THANK YOU 
The Seventh Grade spon-

sors and class express 
appreciation to the mothers 
of the students for their 
efforts in contributing baked 
goods and candles for the 
Halloween Booth prizes. 
Proceeds went to the 
Seventh Grade Fund. 20-ltc 

A.B. WILKINSON 

Survivors include a daughter, Rita 
Mast of Escondido, Calif.; a brother, 
Gober of Vernon; a sister, Lyda 
Wilkinson, also of Vernon; six 
grandchildren and a great-grand-
child. 

To report emergencies or 
any suspicious activity, 
any time of the day or 
night, Marshal, 238-1133; 
Deputy Marshal, 238-1635; 
City Hall, 238-1116; if no 
answer, 806481-3303, She-
riff's department. 48-tfnc 

McGuire and the Rev. Derrell 
Lewis, officiating. 

Burial was in the Bovina 
Cemetery by Parsons-Ellis Funeral 
Home of Friona with Masonic 
graveside rites. 

He was a member of the First 
Baptist Church, Masonic Lodge 977, 
the Scottish Rite, El Paso Consistory 
30 and the Khiva Temple of 
Amarillo. He was a veteran of World 
War II, serving in the Navy. 

Wilkinson was born Sept. 26, 1894 
in Beaver Creek, Texas and married 
Cora Trisler Jan. 10, 1924. He moved 
to Bovina in 1930 and farmed until 
his retirement. Mrs. Wilkinson died 
in September, 1976. 

Services were held Tuesday 
afternoon for Steven G. Walling, 24, 
who died Friday in Grand Junction, 
Colo., following a traffic accident 
earlier this month. 

Walling died in Clagett Memorial 
Hospital, where he was being 
treated for chest and skull injuries 
he suffered in the Nov. 5 mishap on 
Interstate 70, four miles west of 
Rifle, Colo. 

State highway patrol officials said 
his auto went off the right side of the 
road, struck four posts, and 
travelled back across the westbound 
lane. The vehicle then went into the 
median and rolled, coming to rest on 
its top. 

Services were in Bovina First 
Baptist Church with the Rev. J.J. 
Terry and the Rev. James Putnam 
officiating. Burial was in Bovina 
Cemetery by Parsons-Ellis Funeral 
Home of Friona. 

Walling had worked as a steel 
worker and was employed by his 
father, Tiny Walling, in Grand Whitecotton. . 

FOR SALE....To be moved. 
2-bedroom farm house, box 
car and outbuildings. 3/4  
mile east of Pleasant Hill 
and 11/4  mile north on State 
Line Road. E.J. Hester, 700 
E. 5th, Clovis. 505-763-4048. 

19-5tc 

BOVINA ISD....is accepting 
applications for a teacher 
aide in the instructional 
program at Ridgelea 
School. Applicants should be 
fluent in Spanish and 
English. Application forms 
can be obtained at Ridgelea 
and interviews will be held 
Tuesday, Nov. 29, from 2 till 
4 p.m. at Ridgelea. 	20-1tc 

Grants To 
Aid County 

FOUR BEDROOMS, 3 
baths; lovely brick home; 
close to school. Have to see 
to appreciate. Jack Wolt-
mon Realty Co., 238-1242. 

4-tfnc 

(Continued from Page 1) 

Jeanne Kerby and Joel Nelson, have 
to be temporarily content with 
second place and 111 points each. 

Stanberry 
Rites Held 

IF YOU....Have borrowed 
jacks, gas cans or air tanks 
from us, will you PLEASE 
return them at your earliest 
convenience? Charles Oil 
Co. 

Of the contestants who were four 
to six points behind Cumpton last 
week, Dixie Carson and Donna 
Malcom of Tulia, picked up two 
points and Donna Grissom, Jacque 
Nabers, Joel Nelson and Emmett 
Tabor were able to gain one point. 

19-2tc 
ismorssenansonannonsonsia 

I Your local used 
cow dealer 
is 	 

lfriona bi-products 
Call Collect 247-3032 

For 7 days a week dead 
stock ock rem oval an  s   

Sam F. Billingsley, 85, of 
Oklahoma Lane Community, died 
last Wednesday. 

Services were held on Friday in 
Oklahoma Lane Methodist Church 
with the Rev. Harvey Whitenburg, 
pastor, officiating, assisted by Cecil 
Bunch, pastor of the Bovina Church 
of Christ. Burial was in the Bailey 
County Memorial Park Cemetery by 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home, 
Muleshoe. 

Billingsley was born in Morgan 
Mill and had lived in Parmer County 
51 years, moving to the county from 
Estelline. He married Ruby Jones 
Nov. 6, 1919, in Clarendon. He was a 
retired farmer and a veteran of 
World War I. He was a member of 
theFriona Veterans of Foreign Wars 
and the Oklahoma Lane Methodist 
Church for 43 years. 

Survivors include his wife, Ruby; 
a son, Conda of Abernathy; a sister, 
Mrs. Maude Funderburk of Farwell; 
three grandchildren, one of whom is 
Ted Billingsley, youth minister of 
the Bovina Church of Christ, and two 
great-grandchildren. 

• * 	_ 

FOR SALE....Amy portable 
disc rollers. One 1967, 
reconditioned. One 1975, 
reconditioned. Two high lift 
jacks and extra parts. 
Phone 383-1487 or 6666 
Pouillord, Lot 96, Amarillo, 

! Texas 79108. 	20-2tc 

Whitecotton made the greatest 
jump with his first-place 11 points. 
Under 100 last week and trailing 
Cumpton by eight, he now has a 
share of third place, only four points 
off the pace. 

I HELP WANTED....Perma- 
▪ nent Feed Record Clerk. 

Proficiency on ten-key ad-
I ding machine and typing 
I required. Experience with 
I electronic posting machines 
▪ helpful. Six-day week, vaca-

tion, group insurance. Sa- 
• lary commensurate with 
I experience. Apply Parmer 
I County Cattle Co., Inc., 4 

— 	miles west of Bovina, Texas 
frAitezvoc>rxiteavvat< >21>C4V.c52V Vat( ASK Ater- 	on U.S. 60. 	 19-tfnc 

Two weeks remain in the race for 
grand prize, this week and one more. 
The contestant with the high score 
receives $100 for grand prize at the 
conclusion of the contest. 

Governor Dolph Briscoe has 
approved four criminal justice 
grants affecting Parmer County. 

They are: 
--$10,190 to ]54th Judicial District, 

which serves Parmer, Bailey and 
Lamb counties, for a criminal 
investigator; 

--$40,289 to the Panhandle Region-
al Planning Commission for the 1978 
planning grant; 

—$56,367 to the Panhandle Region-
al Law Enforcement Academy for 
law officer training throughout the 
region; and 

--$17,362 for an automatic com-
munication tape monitor for the 
Amarillo Police Department. 

The local grants were among 121 
approved by Governor Briscoe 
statewide from Law Enforcement 
Assistance Administration (LEAA) 
funds under the Crime Control Act of 
1976. 

4 

Buford Stanberry of Bovina died 
suddenly la-t Friday afternoon. 

Services were held Monday 
afternoon at Bovina Church of Christ 
with Cecil Bunch, pastor, officiating. 
Burial was in Bovina Cemetery by 
Parsons-Ellis Funeral Home of 
Friona. 

Born in Missouri, Stanberry had 
lived in Bovina for several years. He 
married Pamela Wright in 1975 at 
Miami, Okla. 

Surviving are his wife, three 
daughters, Lawana and Sheila, both 
of Harrison, Ark., and Sandra of 
Bovina; two sons, Johnnie and 
Allen, both of Harrison; his father, 
Thogal of Bovina; a sister, Mrs. 
Brenda McNeely of Fort Worth; 
three brothers, Harold, Dean and 
Danny, all of Bovina. 

Need a better Band Instru-I 
•••••.1+•••••fl/IF... 

CUSTOM FARM WORK mNeewnt? aGnodo d 
Used
Se  l Selection 

Expert 
 t i o n 	xnow 
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4 Repairs . 
118m 

Phillips 
  anin Clovis, 

 H o u s e  of m  

N.M. Phone 505-763-5041. 
1-tfnc 

McKillip Drag Line Service. 
Excavation and dirt mov- 
hg. Call Farwell, 481-3302. 

34-tfnc Everything from beet harvesting to 
heavy tillage. Contact Travis or Bob at 
Parmer County Implement Company. 

Phone 238-1373 	4-4tc 

BERNINA sewing machine 
sales and service. Repairs 
on all makes. All work 
guaranteed. 100 Mitchell, 
Clovis, N.M. 505-769-1871. 

18-4tc 

AUCTIONS 
>MX Mit< 7.i!K >91“: )41LX ACC>IPX>211X>1003112013COOX >2IX 

EDGE OF TOWN....4 bed-
rooms, 3 baths, all carpeted, 
swimming pool, barn and 
corrals. Six acres. Priced to 
sell. Jack Woltmon Realty 
Co., 238-1242. 	14-tfnc 

TAX DISCOUNT 
TAX PAYERS Now Booking 

1977 & 1978 Auctions 
FOR SALE....14x72 mobile 
home. Two bedrooms and 
two baths. Take up for 
payments. In Bovina. For 
information, call Ruidoso, 
N.M. (505) 257-4147. 46-tfnc 

I Contrary To Many Rumors — We Are Not 
Booked Up — W. Have Plenty Of Sale Dates 
Available — Contact Us Day or Night — We 
Solicit.. And Appreciate Your Business. 

CRUCE & LONG AUCTIONEERS 

I 
I 

C 

I 

I 

I 
I 

'.4 

• 
• • 
• 
• 

OF 

PARMER COUNTY 
TAKE 

LADIES....Holidays will be upon us 
soon. For cleaner, brighter carpeting, 
call for STERI-STEAM. We remove 
suds, soil and residues left by other 
cleaning methods. 

THOMAS CARPET CLEANING 
SERVICE 

Call 238-1640 
Bovina, Texas 79009 

........................t.•••••••••Nu••••••••••••••••••-••••••••••••••••••••••..•••••••••••...••••••••••••••••.••••••••••••••11r 

BOVINA ELECTRIC 
Dale Berggren 

225-6505 or 2254535 
42-tfnc I James G. Cruce 

806-296-7252 • 

Box 1921 
Plainview, Texas 79072 

-phone- 
James M. "Mike" Long 

806-293.8883 
••••••-••••• • .4. W.,. • •••• • • 'ma. • 	•-•••••• • 	• • •••••• • "mi. • • 	• ...a • 	• 	• • •••• • • •••••• • •••••••••••.• • 	• 

i J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY, INC • 
t - • PIA 	SALE 	Electric • 

	

1095th Street 	
sprinkler 

center 	pivot' 
f system. Phone 

	

Farwell, Texas 	 247-3311 after 6 p.m. 29-tfnc, 
 

I. 
i 	Phone (806)481-3288 	i 
i 	• 	- , 	- 	 i 
; 	Office Time-9 a.m.-5 p.m. Monday through Friday 	/ 

Saturday-By Appointment 	 i 

	

- 	f 

LOST....Doberman Pinsch-
er, black and rust, brown 
leather collar. Disappeared 
vicinity of Super-Market 
last Thursday. Reward. Call 
763-5084 in Clovis or come by 
120 Griffin in Texico. 19-tfnc + + + + 

Nice, clean 3-bedroom, 2-bath home with 
large yard. Good location on Third 
Street in Bovina. 

+ + + + 
Nice 2 bedroom house on Third Street in 
Bovina. Priced right. 

++++ 

ADVANTAGE 

OF YOUR 
DISCOUNT r alsairm anams in a a a - Non a 

• • 

• 

• 

• 

WE NEED FARM 
LISTINGS--NOW 

160 Acres—lays real good. Good water 
area. Has beautiful brick home near 
Highway. 

I 

I 
I 
I 

(
i 

i

I
I  

I 

I 
I 

2% IF PAID IN NOVEMBER 
1% IF PAID IN DECEMBER 

WHY PAY MORE FOR 
YOUR NUTS AND BOLTS? 

15% to 25% Discounts 
Bins And Assortments 

.578-4384 HEREFORD, TEXAS tin  
to an Er EN imml,An! me !No in a 08 pm _int nu= API al 
911,111-rairtf: 7.4000011111017001111K,MIKAMOVIIIKANK 

• 
• 

i 

BID NOTICE 
Bovina Independent School 
District is accepting sealed 
bids for the repair or 
renovation of its existing 
steam heating system. Bids 
may be submitted for the 
repair or renovation of (1) 
the control system or (2) the 
piping system or (3) the 
total job. Prospective bid-
ders are invited to visit the 
school for examination and 
assessment of the system. 
All inquiries to Larry 
Wilson, Supt. 806-238-1494. 
Bids will be opened Dec. 13, 
1977 at 7:30 P.M. at Ridgelea 
School. Mail bids to Bovina 
I.S.D., Box 70, Bovina, TX. 
79009. The Board of Trustees 
has the right to accept or 
,reject any or all bids. 19-2tc This Discount Is On All 

State And County Taxes 

Collected By The County 

Tax Collector 

• 

• 
• 

IN ORDER TO BETTER SERVE 

OUR CUSTOMERS IN BOVINA 
AREA, WE HAVE INSTALLED A 

DIRECT LINE. CALL US ANY 

'TIME FOR SALES OR SERVICE. 

238-1373 1 
Parmer County 
Implement Co. 

Friona,rwas  
nor >moat; meteamoamompoin encia 

Texas 

• 

Hugh Moseley 
• 

Tax Assessor And Collector 
Parmer County, Texas 

I 	 + + + + 
t 	555 acres, irrigated, with one GHW 360. 
I 	Located south of Farwell. A good one!! 

I 	
+ t + t 

1 	
• 80acres, irrigated; lays nearly perfect. 
West Camp Area. 

t 	 + + + + 

t 	2 bedroom, 1 bath house with barn and 
I 	out buildings, has a fenced chicken area. 	i 

t
In Bovina. 	 t 

t
+ + + + 

320 acres, irrigated. Two 8-inch wells.  
t 	Good water area. Lays nearly perfect. 	i 

t 
 Near Farwell city limits. 	a 	 t 

t 	
+ + + + 	 .1 

I 
	

Extra large nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 	t 
ihome with garage, good location near 

school in Bovina.  
I 	 ++++ 	 t 

I 	Good commercial lot with good building 	i 

1 	
.on highway In Bovina. Good location. 	i 

i 	. 	 i 
Extra 	eat 	1 tin 3 	oom, 1 bath 

t 

I 	
brick h 	 lam 	enced back 

Savings Is Great—Invest In Real Estate 	t t 	
yard. 	ovl 

 

i i 
"Sales And Loans Are Our Service" 

tifsaa C.A.. .. .16. . .."•••• . •••••• • nun.... 're. • • -.is • . •••. • • "a. on.. .•••••..• •••. sr...a .... ••••••••••••••.• • .... • • .... . . •••••• • 
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WITHDRAWAL INTEREST BALANCE 

00.00 

00 

0 0 
00 . 0 0 
00.0 
00 . 0 0 

10 15 00 

00.00 

00 . 0 0 
0 0 . 00 

DATE 
1/1 
1/15 

DEPOSIT 
00.03 
00 . 0 0 

0 0 . 00 2/1 
2/15 

0 0 . 00 
0 0 . 0 0 

00 . 0 0 

0 0 . 00 
0 0 . 0 0 
00 . 0 0 

00 • 00- 
0 0 . 00 

00.00 
00 . 00 

00 00 
00.00 

.00 
00.00 
00 00 
00.00 
00 00 

00 . 0 0 
00 . 00 

00.00 
00 . 00 

0 0 . 0 0 
00 . 00 

3/1 
3 15 
9/1 

4/15 
5 1 
5/15 
6/1 
6/15 

0 0 . 00 
0 0 . 00 

0 0 . 0 0 
00 . 00 

0 0 . 00 
00.00 7/1 

7/15 
8/1 
8/15 

9/1 
9/15 
10/1 

00 00 
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00.00 
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0 0 . 00 
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0 0 . 0 0 
0 0 . 00 
0 O. 00 
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0 0 . 00 
00.00 
0 0 . 00 
00 . 0 0 

0 0 . 00 
0 0 . 00 

00.00 
.00 

00 00 
00.00 

0 0 . 00 
0 0 . 00 

00 . 00 
0 0 . 00 
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TOP SQUAWS, 50-48 Shelby Has Great 
Season At McMurry Fillies Break 

Friona's Jinx 

, Rita 
)the 
Lyda 

six 
rand. 

Friona's Rhonda Parsons for the 
ball are Pat Shepherd (51) and Sandi 
Sides (43). Denise McCormick is 
shown at the right. 

FILLIES WIN....The Bovine Fillies 
beat the Friona Squaws for the first 
time in several years last Friday at 
Friona, 50-48. Shown battling 

Ponies Stumble In 
First Cage Outings 

ha 
astice 

itric 
r an 
mina 

185 pound frame with his tough 
inside running. More often than not, 
he was the man the Tribe called on 
for those key third down and short 
yardage situations. 

Consistently ranking among the 
top small college scorers in the 
nation, Doc scored 12 touchdowns in 
ten games. His 72 points was by far 
the top mark in the conference. Also, 
Doc scored the most points of any 
McMurry back since 1953 and he 
now ranks fourth on the all-time list. 

Doc added 13 pass receptions to 
his remarkable season statistics for 
186 yards and a 13.6 yard per catch 
average. Two of his catches went for 
touchdowns. On one of those 
touchdown catches, Doc left the 
McMurry crowd in an absolute 
frenzy. He took a screen pass at 
mid-field, then picked, weaved and 
danced his way through the entire 
opposing defense - 

At one point, Doc was named 
conference "Player of the Week" for 
his performance against Austin 
College. All he did in that one, was 
rush for 171 yards on 26 carries and 
added three pass receptions 

With a very young team, McMurry 
managed a solid winning season in 
1977. All indications are that next 
year could well be the "Year of the 
Tribe" and with Doc Shelby 
returning for his senior season, the 
opposing teams are already circling 
the wagons. 

Billy "Doc" Shelby of Bovina, has 
just completed one of the finest 
seasons ever for a McMurry College 
runningback. 

The Indians finished the year with 
a 6-4 record and, when the dust has 
finally settled, Doc Shelby's all-pur-
pose performances will be viewed as 
the main reason the Tribe posted its 
best won-lost record since 1968. 

"Doc Shelby is simply an 
outstanding football player," says 
McMurry head coach Spud Al-
dridge. "You seldom see a back that 
is good in every situation, but Doc is. 
He is an exceptional runner, both 
inside and outside, he catches the 
ball, throws it occasionally, and he is 
among the best blockers on the 
team. Doc is our bread and butter. I 
won't be the least bit surprised if he 
makes small college All-American 
next year." 

A truly gifted runner, Doc gained 
842 yards on 155 carries this year 
and posted an outstanding 5.4 yards 
per carry average. He was the 
second leading rusher in the 
conference (Texas Intercollegiate 
Athletic Association) and his per 
carry average was by far the best in 
the league. Doc's longest touchdown 
run of the season came on a 64 yard 
scamper in the season opener. 

But Doc's dazzling open field runs 
are by no means his only talent. He 
proved time and again that he 
packed a mighty wallop on his 5-11, 
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Bovina High School's Mustangs, 
facing two tough class AA 
opponents, dropped their first two 
basketball games of the 1977-78 
season. 

The Ponies fell to Muleshoe, 58-34 
in their season opener last Tuesday. 
Friday night, the team played 
Friona close for the first half, but 
fell to the Chieftains' second half 
onslaught, 72-38. 

The Mustangs stayed right with 
the Chiefs, picked as one of the 
contenders in always tough District 
3-AA, matching them basket for 
basket during the first half, before 
the roof caved in during the third 
quarter. 

In the Friday game, Friona scored 
first, and led throughout the first 
quarter. But Mike Read and Gerald 
Shelby led a Mustang rally that 
allowed Bovina to catch up. 

Shelby's basket with 56 seconds 
left in the opening quarter trimmed 
Friona's lead to two, 11-9, and he 
canned a long jump shot right at the 
buzzer that tied the game at 11-all. 

Again, Friona took a lead to start 
the second quarter, but again 
Bovina rallied. Shelby's layup cut an 
18-13 Friona lead to three at 18-15. 
Shelby later rebounded his own 
missed free throw and sank a basket 
for a 24-20 deficit with 42 seconds left 
in the half. 

Ruben Salazar scored the last 
basket of the first half, 15 seconds 
ahead of the buzzer, and that 
trimmed Friona's lead at the 
intermission to 24-22. 

But the Chieftains came out the 
second half with a full-court press, 
and outscored the Mustangs, 20-2 in 
the first 61/2  minutes of the quarter, 
stretching what had been a two point 
lead to 20, 44-24. 

When the period finally ended, 
Friona had outscored the Ponies, 

26-6, and had taken a 50.28 lead. 
The Ponies' hard luck continued, 

as Friona built up their lead to 33 
points, at which point both teams 
emptied their benches, and the 
reserves finished up. 

Shelby was high point man for the 
Mustangs with 12 points. 

In their game at Muleshoe, the 
Mustangs trailed after the first 
quarter, 9-2, and at the half, 24-5, as 
the team could not find the basket. 

Bovina finally outscored their 
hosts, 19-16 in the final quarter, but 
by that time the outcome had 
virtually been decided. Roy Shelby 
led Bovina's scoring with nine 
points. 

"In the boys' loss on Tuesday, the 
coach was looking them over, giving 
all a chance to play. The boys had 
only one day of workouts before 
playing Muleshoe and it will take a 
little longer for them to round out." 

BOVINA 	11 22 28 38 
Friona 	11 24 50 72 

Gerald Shelby 4-4-12; Roy Shelby 
1-1--3; Eddie Isaac 2-0-4; Del Ray 
Sudderth 2-0-4; Richard Villarreal 
1-3--5; Mike London 0-2-2; Mike 
Read 3-0-6; Ruben Salazar 1-0-2; 
Doug Roming 0-0-0. 

+ -I- -4- + 
BOVINA 	2 5 15 30 
Muleshoe 	9 24 42 53 

R. Shelby 4-1-9; G. Shelby 3-2-8; 
D. Sudderth 3-1-7; M. Read 0-1-1; 
R. Salazar 1-0-2; R. Villarreal 3-1-7. 

THANK YOU 
We wish to thank the 

community and Cecil Bunch 
for all their acts of kindness 
during this time. A special 
thanks goes to the Bovina 
Church of Christ for serving 
dinner. 

SHELBY IN ACTION...A jersey was 
about the only thing the Austin 
College defense could get a grip on 

all day as Billy "Doc" Shelby of 
Bovina, cruised to 171 yards on 26 
carries for the day. 

became aroused and scored eight 
straight points in the last 2:25 of the 
quarter, to tie the game at 41-all. 

Free shots by Misses Moody and 
Shelby gave the Fillies a 44-41 lead to 
open the final quarter, but Friona 
came back to tie the score, and went 
ahead for the first time in the second 
half, 46-44, on a hook shot by Linda 
Nelson with 5:43 to play. The 
Squaws' Cindy Cleveland followed 
with a layup, and Bovina was down 
by four, 48-44. 

But the Fillies were not about to 
give up. A long jump shot by Miss 
Moody tied the score for Bovina at 
48-all with 3:25 left to play. 

Both teams missed chances to 
score, as the scoreboard stayed at 
48-48 for what seemed like an 
eternity. Then in a frantic final 
minute, Bovina got the tip after a 
jump ball on their offensive end of 
the court. 

Belinda Shelby then hit the bucket, 
with only 37 seconds showing, for the 
all-important lead. 

Great defense by the Fillies kept 
Friona from tying up the game and 
perhaps forcing an overtime. Friona 
missed a shot with 13 seconds left, 
and Bovina got the ball at midcourt 
after a mad scramble for the 
rebound. 

Final score was Bovina 50, Friona 
48. 

In the Muleshoe game, Belinda 
Shelby and Denise Read were hitting 
for 17 and 14 points, respectively. 

Coach Joel Nelson said, "The 
Fillies succeeded on less than half of 
their free throws and scored only 
four points in the third quarter of the 
Muleshoe game. That tells the story. 
You can't miss that many chances 
and expect to win. 

"We had a very good defensive 
game on Friday at Friona, although 
we had another bad third quarter. 
They outscored us, 30-10, in that 
period. The offense was improved 
over Tuesday. 

"I am real pleased to beat Friona 
at Friona. They beat Vega on 
Tuesday (Nov. 15) and I know it has 
been years since we last won against 
Friona. 
FILLIES 	13 31 41 50 
Friona 	11 21 41 48 

Pat Shepherd 3-1-7; Belinda 
Shelby 5-3-13; Denise Read 1-4-6; 
Kim Naegle 0-0-0; Elyese Moody 
8-6-22. Guards: Sandi Sides, Carol 
Ware, Diane Gilbreath, Claudia 
Chisom. 

VARSITY GIRLS 
Muleshoe 	15 25 36 52 
Bovina 	11 22 26 39 

Belinda Shelby, 17; Denise Read, 
14. 

Bovina High School's Fillies broke 
even in their first two basketball 
games of the 1977 season. The Fillies 
were competing against Muleshoe 
and Friona, two teams expected to 
fight it out for the neighboring 
District 3-AA title. 

In their opening game at Muleshoe 
November 15, the Fillies dropped a 
52-39 decision to the Mulettes, 
considered one of the stronger teams 
in the area. However, Coach Joel 
Nelson's crew came back to defeat 
Friona, 50-48 in a hair-raiser Friday 
night. 

Both of the team's first two games 
were on the road. 

The Fillies were in command most 
of the way in their win over the 
neighboring Squaws, but had to 
overcome a spirited second half 
rally that saw Friona erase a 
ten-point deficit and recapture the 
lead in the last quarter. 

A great performance by freshman 
Elyese Moody played a vital role in 
Bovina's win. Miss Moody came in 
to add a spark to the Fillies' offense, 
and when the books were tallied, she 
turned out to be the team's top 
scorer with 22 points, tying Friona's 
Rhonda Parsons for game honors. 

Friona scored first, but Pat 
Shepherd put in a shot with 1:35 gone 
to tie the count at 2-2. Belinda 
Shelby's free shot a minute later 
gave Bovina its first lead at 3-2. 

The lead changed hands four more 
times in the quarter. After Friona 
took a 5-3 lead, Denise Read's pair of 
free shots tied it for the Fillies at 
5-all with 4:44 on the clock. Miss 
Shelby's shot with 3:33 left gave 
Bovina a 7-5 advantage. 

Friona scored the next five points, 
for a 7-10 score, but Miss Moody's 
jump shot at 0:53 tied the score at 
11-all, and Miss Shelby popped the 
nets at 0:20, and gave Bovina the 
lead at the quarter break, 13-11. 

With Misses Moody and Read 
scoring, Bovina hiked its margin to 
17-11 to open the second quarter, and 
after Friona countered with two 
points, Misses Shepherd and Shelby 
scored to give the Fillies an 
eight-point edge at 21-13 with 5: 34 
left in the half. 

A pair of jump shots and two free 
throws by Miss Moody within 1:33 of 
clock time stretched the Fillies' lead 
to 13 points at 28-15, and Miss Read's 
free throw at 2:15 gave Bovina its 
longest lead of the game at 29-15. 

Friona rallied to score six of 
the last eight points and trim the 
margin to ten at the half, 31-21. 

The Fillies maintained an eight to 
ten point lead for most of the third 
quarter, before the home team 

The Family of 
Buford Stanberry 

20-1tc 

TWO POINTS....Elyese Moody of 
the Bovina Fillies gets off a shot 
over the guard of her Friona 
opponent. Miss Moody, a freshman, 
came in and became the leading 
scorer for the Fillies in the contest, 
which they won, 50-48. 

NO DEPOSIT 
NO RETURN 

In the changing world of finance, there's one sure 

thing that always stays the same . . . if you don't 

put any money away . . . you never get any back. 

Wise use of your money demands a sound and prac-

tical savings program. It's the only way we know 

to get a constant and good return on your money. 

You might just say it's a matter of no deposit, no 

return. Open a savings account today . . . where 

you can watch the sum rise. 

lErtair nfl;a•.AL I 	- 	• 
a FSLIC  

, 	• 	 ! 

HOME OFFICE 	BRANCH OFFICE 
801 Pile St. 	 2nd and .Abilene SI. 

CLOVIS, N, MEX. 	PORTALES, N: MEX. 

SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION OF -CLOVIS 

(DEPOSITS INSURED UP JO $40,000.001 

"WATCH THE SUM.RIS E". 
:• rARMER ETC 

. 	. 

WHOA, MAN....Eddie Isaac of the 
Mustangs tries to catch Friona's 
Wesley Clark, who went in for a 
layup on a fast break. Isaac couldn't 
quite head the Chieftain off. Clark 
was Friona's high point man with 24 
points. 
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SPERRY AND 
HUTCHINSON 

WE WILL BE CLOSED THURSDAY, THANKSGIVING DAY! 

gLTAI3L21/417ED 
1896 

ARIETY/QUALITY 
PRICES GOOD WEEK OF NOVEMBER 25 THRU NOVEMBER 30 

VALUE 
.00•100"as 

KING SIZE 

WILSON'S SLICED 

SLAB BACON r-d 
LB. 89' 

FISHER'S SPANISH 

RAW 
PEANUTS 

12 OZ. BAG 

59C 
AR0R0 LABEL vvoirrE 

SYRUP 
32 OZ. lAR 

99° 
LUX LIQUID 

QUART BOTTLE 

$119 

FRESH SLICED 

PORK STEAK 
LB. $ 1 19 

• 

GRAIN FED FREEZER BEEF 
AT--.2 CUT & WRAPPED TO YOUR SPECIFICATIONS 

HUTCHINSON 

USDA GOOD 	USDA CHOICE 

HALVES LB. 83C 	HALVES LB. 84C 
SINGLES & H GREEN STAMPS 

GIVEN ON ALL OUR FREEZER PACK MEATS ••=0 

PECAN COFFEE CAKE 	7 
LARGE SIZE 1129 

EACH  70= 
GREEN GIANT 	 141 

 xi 2 BROCCOLI SPEARS 	 Broccoli ,Butter ~~ 

IN BUTTER SAUCE 10 OZ. PKG. 49c 

r uEiN;',AN, 

FRESH 
PRODUCE 

EW 
eget FLORIDA 

v TANGERINES 
3 us. 17 1 00 

CENTRAL AMERICAN AMERICAN 
GOLDEN 

BANANAS 

5LBs.1 

'41KP. 
4,414.spaie! 

DEL MONTE 

SWEET PICKLES liAr 59' 
ELLIS 

VIENNA SAUSAGE 5c: 3/$l o0 

f.--)MMININNEVIIMEMENINEMENEMBEINIa 
FROZEN FOODS 

SARA LEE 

DR. PEPPER 
6 66°11 79C PLUS 

CpR 	 Epos„ 

The Prices On The Ben Franklin Christmas Circular Which You Received Last Week , Continue In 
Effect Until December 1. 

(Redeem Your S & H Green Stamps In Our Store Use Our Easy Lay-Away Plan) 

Bovina Supermarket& 
DOUBLE STAMPS ON WEDNESDAY Tamily Center WITH '2.50 PURCHASE OR MORE  

"BIG CITY SELECTIONS 
SMALL TOWN CONVENIENCE" 
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