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ARM Leaders Start 
Washington D.C. Trip 

BY BILL ELLIS 
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By LISA HOWELL 
"The Tractors Are Coming" is a 

slogan on one of the bumper stickers 
representing the American Agricul-
ture Movement, and may also be 
quoted by several modern day Paul 
Revere type people from Texas to 
Washington, D.C. during the next 
few weeks. 

Last year the American Farmers 
went to Washington as lobbyists to 
make known their intentions. This 
year with all that behind them, they 
are going to try to get results from\ 
last year's efforts. 

According to Ralph Roming, a 
Bovina farmer, the farmers' goal is 
not to get 100 per cent parity but to 
get the administration to enforce the 
present farm bill to its maximum 
which calls for 90 per cent of parity 
through loans. In this way the 
farmers can get a better price for 
their commodities and try to save 
the rural communities and farms. If 
they reach this goal, then in 1980 
there will be a chance to write new 
farm legislation asking for 100 per 
cent parity. 

The farmers feel they are not 
going to Washington through selfish 
motives. Some feel the government 
is trying to drive them out of 
business. A business that is capable 
of growing enough food and other 
commodities to sufficiently supply 
our county as well as sell goods to 
dher countries at a fair price and in 
this way help balance the nation's 
budget. 

Saturday morning, January 13, 
farmers from Friona, Bovina, 
Muleshoe and Portales met at 
Robertson Electric in Friona to form 
a small portion of the tractorcade 
that will steadily grow bigger and 
bigger as they meet with farmers 
from different states along the way 
to Washington. There will be eight 
major starting points and eight 
major routes followed by farmers 
from different areas. 

The local farmers were on their 
way to Bushland which was the 
collecting point for all tractors 
coming from the surrounding towns. 
From there the group left together 
Monday, January 15. 

They plan to drive seven hours 
each day with the exception of 
Sundays which will be reserved for 
worship and rest. Service trucks will 
be accompanying them along the 
way in case there is a problem with 
one of the tractors. 

A "wagonmaster" will travel 
ahead of the tractorcade in order to 
decide on a location suitable to park 
the tractors each night. Camper rigs 
are also being taken along in order 
to better accommodate the farmers. 

Rallies will be held along the way 
and with the help of these rallies the 
farmers hope to educate the urban 
people of the threat of higher food 
prices yet to come. Different states 
will be organizing the rallies some of 
which will be held in Oklahoma, 

CONCERT SET 

Sorleys Produce 
Religious Album 

A NUMBER OF FARMERS from 
the local area set out on Monday to 
make the long trip to Washington, 
D.C. with their tractors, in an effort 

I* to lobby for favorable farm 
legislation. 

The only thing the farmers have as 
a guarantee is a long, hard trip, and 
they probably can expect some 
adversities from the weather. 

But farmers are used to battling 
,40 the weather, as evidenced by the 

area's cotton farmers, who are still 
trying to finish harvesting their 
crop. 

We wish the members of the 
American Agricultural Movement 
well in their efforts to battle for 

4 higher prices so that the family farm 
will not become a thing of the past. 
Farming is threatened by the 
corporate movement, along with 
foreign ownership, if the small, 
family farms continue to fall by the 
wayside. 

The farmers will not have an easy 
time of it, since Washington is a 
tough nut to crack. But this group is 
a stubborn lot, and when they 
are perched in their tractors, they 
may command a little more 
attention on the streets of 
Washington than they do in Bovina, 
Texas. 

Co-op Fuel Div. 
In Business Here 

Family," "There's Something 
That's Different About Him," 
"God's Wonderful People," "Oh 
What A Day," "Jesus, He Means All 
the World to Me," "I Just Can't 
Figure It Out," "I Walked Today 
Where Jesus Walked," "Jesus Be 
the Lord of All," "Jesus Came Into 
My Life," and "Something Beauti-
ful," a medley. 

The album was recorded at Don 
Caldwell Studios at Lubbock, and 
is marketed under the "Pure Love" 
label. 

Dorothy and Grady Sorley of 
Bovina did something recently that 
they had been thinking about doing 
for a long time. They made a record 
album. Title of the record is "Sweet 
'n Easy." 

The Sorleys will be featured at a 
concert at First Baptist Church 
Sinday evening, beginning at 7:00 
p.m. The concert will be followed by 
a reception and autograph party at 
the church's fellowship hall. 

"For several years Dorothy and I 
talked about making an album, but 
always talked ourselves out of it for 
various reasons. We have enjoyed 
singing together for many years, but 
only in the last few years have we 
dedicated ourselves to doing 
whatever the Lord would have us 
do," Grady says in a statement 
contained on the album cover of the 
new production. 

"We feel the Lord has led us to put 
together our album at this particular 
time, for reasons He only knows. We 
just praise Him for letting us be a 
part of it," Sorley continues. 

The Sorleys are members of First 
Baptist Church, and are active in the 
youth ministry of the church. Grady 
serves as music director of the 
church at the present time. 

The album of religious music 
contains ten songs. They are "God's 

Their album is also on sale at the 
Browsabout and Bovina Supermar-
ket as a long-playing record or in 
ei :Jilt-track tape form. 

Grady and Dorothy are featured in 
four full-color photographs on the 
album cover, including a large 
picture on the front and three 
smaller pictures on the back cover. 

Bovina Wheat Growers' fuel 
division (the former Bonds Oil 
Company) is in full-scale operation, 
with most of the same employees 
who formerly worked for Bonds Oil. 

"These employees are acquainted 
with folks in the Bovina area, and 
they will attempt to serve their 
needs to the best of their abilities," 
says Larry Webb, general manager 
of Bovina Wheat Growers. 
Pat Read has been retained as 

bookkeeper; E.E. Miles is bulk 
deliveryman ; and Domingo Meza is 
serviceman. 
Webb pointed out that the 

company's fuel division would retain 
all of the services formerly featured 
at Bonds Oil Company, including on 
the farm service, all major brands 
of oil, Safemark, Michelin and Co-op 
Tires, and a new keylock pump 
service for regular and unleaded 
gas. 
"We can continue to service your 

diesel trucks, as in the past. Also, we 
still have one of the best selections of 
auto parts in the area, with the same 
brands and stock as always," Webb 
continued. 
The newly re-organized business 

is planning a Grand Opening in the 
near future, as soon as new signs 

Arkansas, Tennessee, North Caro-
lina and Virginia. 

On behalf of all the farmers in this 
area, Ron Awtrey expressed the fact 
that everything will be done strictly 
according to the law. No militant 
action is planned to be taken. 

Some of the community people 
feel that by taking tractors with 
pitchforks and shovels displayed in 
plain view, the farmers are asking 
for trouble. Awtrey explained that 
the tractors were a means of 
attracting the attention of the 
American people and fellow farm-
ers. 

The tools are simply tools of the 
trade, each tractor is equipped with 
them and also with commodities 
that will be sold at market upon the 
arrival in Washington. 

When asked whether or not he 
anticipated any trouble, Roming 
stated "The justice departmentwis 
going to act as laison people between 
the farmers and the different states 
as we go into them, as highway 
patrolmen and port of entry...and 
they said that they would try to head 
off any trouble, take care of this 
situation and get us to Washington." 

The farmers plan to stay in 
Washington, by taking shifts, for as 
long as it takes to get results. They 
would like to encourage all of the 
support they can get from the 
people. They feel that the people 
need to realize that this is their fight 
as well as the farmers'. Trucks will 
be needed in Washington to help 
return the tractors. People are being 
encouraged to meet the farmers and 
ride into Washington with them. 

There are plans for a pub!ic 
auction to be held in Parmer County 
when the farmers return, to help 
raise money that the farmers were 
unable to raise prior to the 
departure. This money will be used 
to help reimburse the farmers for 
their trip to Washington. and other work has been accom-

plished. 
"We hope to continue to provide 

residents of the Bovina area with top 
service for their automotive needs," 
Webb said. 

Beet Growers 
Get Payment 

Card Fund 
Nets '528 

Their son, Ken, made the 
photographs. The Sorleys are 
parents of three children, Phil, Ken 
and Debbie (Mrs. Mike Beau-
champ). 

The Sorleys also have three 
grandchildren, Cole Sorley, Angela 
and Lori Beauchamp. 

Holly Sugar Corporation today 
announced it was making an 
additional sugarbeet payment total-
ling $969004.59. This payment goes to 
sugarbeet growers in eight Texas 
counties and one county in New 
Mexico where sugarbeets were 
grown in 1978. 

Cal Jones, Agricultural Manager 
at Holly's Hereford Plant, said 
contracting the 1979 crop is now in 
progress and encouraged interested 
persons to contact the Holly Sugar 
Agricultural office at 364-2593 so an 
Agriculturalist may contact them. Beet Growers 

Banquet Set 

The 1978 Christmas Card Fund 
designated for the Bovina Ambu-
lance Service received $528 for local 
gifts. Each year residents of the 
Bovina area make a contribution to 
this fund in lieu of sending 
Christmas cards. 

Bovina Women's Study Club 
sponsors this project and each year 
a project is chosen that will benefit 
the entire community. 

Dick Richards, President of the 
Bovina Ambulance Service, stated 
that a portion of this total was used 
to buy an extraction kit and the 
remainder will go towards the 
purchase of summer jackets for the 
ambulance attendants. 

The Study Club wishes to express 
its appreciation to all who were a 
part of this worthy project. 

'Little Miss' Contest 
Slated February 15 

preferably a billfold size, in either 
black and white or color. 
A panel of out of town judges will 

determine the winner of the 
pageant. 

Bill Cleavinger, President of the 
Texas-New Mexico Sugarbeet 
Growers Association, encouraged 
e" sugarbeet growers to attend the 
annual business meeting to be held 
at 2 p.m. Friday, January 19 at the 
Community Center in Hereford and 
attend the banquet Saturday night at 
7 p.m. at the Bull Barn in Hereford. 

Official Entry Blank 
Filthy Doll 44 	Little Miss 7-9 	Junior Miss 10-12 

Name 	 Address 	  

*onsor 	  

Age 	 Height 	 Color of Eyes 	  

Cblor of Hair 	 Grade 	  

}bbbies 	  

Date of Birth 	  

Maternal Grandparents 	  

Paternal Grandparents 	  

Number of Years in Bovina 

By signing this release, the Bovina 
Young Homemakers is released 
from all responsibility for accidents. 

Entry blank and $10 entry fee must 
be turned In to Mrs. Mike 
Beauchamp by noon, Feb. 5. Mail to 
Star Route, Bovina, Texas 79009. 

involved in the Incident. The truck 
came to a rest after clipping a 
gay-wire on a utility pole at the 
btersection of Hwy. 00 and Third 
&reet. 

++++ 
NATIVES OF BOVINA are aware of 
the fact that the community has a lot 
of built-in talent. Regular church-
goers are perhaps more aware of 
this fact, since they have the 
opportunity of hearing a number of 
various of the local citizens perform 
special music. 

Members of the Baptist Church 
have known for some time about the 
talent of Dorothy and Grady Sorley, 
who are called on very often to blend 
their talented voices in song for the 

t local congregation. 
But the Sorleys have recently done 

something they had been talking 
about doing for a long time--they 
recorded an album of religious 
music, and now, everyone in the 
community can have a record album 

* or tape featuring the Sorleys. 
We have heard the album, and feel 

that it is an excellent production, 
and we congratulate Dorothy and 
Grady on their achievement. 

We know that friends of the Bovina 
couple will want to attend the 

• concert and autograph party being 
planned for this Sunday evening at 
First Baptist Church. 

-I- 
JIM LUCAS, attorney for Warren 
Electric Cooperative, is credited 
with finding the following article, 
which originated in Australia. With 

* Americans being threatened on 
every hand by the Environment 
Protection Agency, we thought it 
appropriate: 

"Imperial Chemical Industries 
has announced the discovery of a 
new fire-fighting agent known as 

1/0 WATER (Wonderful and Total 
Extinguishing Resource). It is 
particularly suitable for dealing 
with fires in buildings, timber yards 
and warehouses, and is fairly cheap 
to produce. It is intended that 
quantities of about 11/2  million 
gallons should be stored in open 
ponds or reservoirs near urban 

-areas and installations of high fire 
risk. 

"WATER is already encountering 
opposition from safety and en-
vironmental gruups. One group 
member has pointed out that if 
anyone immersed his head in a 
bucket of WATER, it would prove 
fatal in as little as three minutes. 
Each of the proposed reservoirs will 
contain enough WATER to fill half a 
million three gallon buckets. Each 
,bucketful could be used a hundred or 

* ,more times, so there is enough 
_WATER in one reservoir to kill the 
entire population of the United 
Kingdom. 

"Did we know, asked a fire-
brigade spokesman, what would 

a__ happen to the new medium when it 
7. was exposed to intense heat? It has 

been reported that water is a 
constituent of beer. Does this mean 

(Continued on Page 5) 

The "Little Miss" Pageant will be-
held on Thursday, February 15 at 6 
p.m. in the Bovina High School 
Auditorium. Another division has 
been added to the contest this year. 
The ages for each group are as 
follows: Baby Dolls, 4-6; Little Miss, 
7-9; and Junior Miss, 10-12. 

Businesses wishing to sponsor a 
contestant should contact Mrs. Mike 
Beauchamp at 225-4691 or Star 
Route, Bovina, Texas 79009. Parents 
and grandparents are welcome to be 
the sponsors. The Young Home-
makers will be glad to assist any 
contestant in need of a sponsor. 
Rules of the contest are: 

Girls must be 4-12 years of age on 
or before February 1, 1979 to be 
eligible for any division. 

The official entry blank and a $10 
entry fee must be filed no later than 
noon, February 5. Mail all entry 
blanks and fees to Mrs. Mike 
Beauchamp, Star Route, Bovina, 
Texas 79009. 

No mothers will be allowed during 
rehearsals. Members of Y.H.T. and 
F.H.A. will assist the contestants in 
clothing changes. 

Contestants for all divisions will 
model play outfits and dressy attire. 
The talent presentation has been 

an itted. 
Each contestant must submit a 

photograph with the entry blank, 

TRUCK JACK-KNIFES....This se-
nil-trailer truck lost control and 
jack-knifed after hitting the dip 
bcated on Hwy. 60 near the Sands 
Nbtel.The driver was uninjured and 
here were no other vehicles 

Parent's Signature 

INININGINRIBSSININIMINNolumenel 
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20 YEARS AGO—JANUARY 21, 1969 
Raymond Everett, Jr. and John 

Trevino, both of Bovina, were 
seriously injured Sunday night in a 
one-car accident on Highway 18, 
north of Clovis. 

Rush Looney underwent major 
surgery the first part of this week in 
El Paso. Looney is a former resident 
of the Bovina area, moving from 
here in 1944. 

Mrs. Kenneth Horton was honored 

MEDICINE CHEST 
Phone 238-1659 

Don & Gladys Spring 

When you need 

a prescription 

filled quickly, 

let us deliver it 
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FIRST STATE BANK PRESENTS: 
COW POKES 	 By Ace Reid 
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at a surprise pink and blue shower 
Friday afternoon. The shower was 
given by members of the Good 
Neighbor Home Demonstration Club 
in the home of Mrs. Jack Morris. 

15 YEARS AGO—JANUARY 15, 1964 
Mrs. Achsa Armstrong of Ama-

rillo, who has been visiting in the 
home of Mrs. Lady Armstrong and 
Mrs. J. Sam Gaines, was hospi-
talized Sunday at Memorial Hospital 
in Clovis. 

Bill Denney was re-elected chief of 
Bovina Volunteer Fire Department 
at a regular meeting of the 
organization Monday night at city 
hall. 

Mrs. J.E. Sherrill was honored 
with a pink and blue coffee Thursday 
morning at the home of Mrs. Billy 
Marshall. 

-I- -4- 	+ 
10 YEARS AGO—JANUARY 15, 1989 

James L. Redwine, 55-year-old 
resident of Bailey County, died 
Friday morning in West Plains 
Memorial Hospital, Muleshoe. 

A Young Farmers Chapter will be 
organized here at a meeting on 
Thursday, January 16 at 7 p.m. in 
the vocational agriculture building 
at Bovina Schools, according to 
Ralph Roming, Jerry McClaran and 
John Paul Jones. 

A Teenage Club will sponsor a 
dance Saturday night from 8 to 12 
p.m. in the American Legion Hall. 

+ + 
5 YEARS AGO—JANUARY 23, 1974 
A small private plane, reportedly 

piloted by Andy King of Clovis, 
N.M., made an unscheduled landing 
in a wheat field on Highway 60 west 
of Bovina between Parmer County 
Feedlot and Wilsey Switch late 
Wednesday of last week. 

Widdy Gromowsky, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. William Gromowsky of Star 
Route in Bovina has enrolled in 
Lubbock Christian College (LCC) 
for the spring semester as a 
freshman Bible major. 

Mrs. G.D. Anderson Jr. of Bovina 
is a new member of the board of 
directors of the Amarillo Regional 
Hearing and Speech Foundation, 
Inc., according to an announcement 
by Dr. Gaylord R. Chase, President 
of the board. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Alvan Bandy 
of Bovina will be feted with an open 
house on their Golden Wedding 
Anniversary Sunday from 2:30 to 5 
p.m. at their home at 1101 Avenue K. 
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Five students from foreign 
countries and their advisor were the 
guests of the Bovina Woman's Study 
Club on Thursday, January 11. 
Professor John H. Muthersbough, 
International Student Advisor, 
spoke of the International Student 
Programs at West Texas State 
University. 

Muthersbough stated that there 
are 130 foreign students attending 
West Texas State University at the 
present. These 130 students repre-
sent 30 countries. A total of 1900 
applications were received this 
school year from foreign students to 
enter W.T.S.U. and of these, seventy 
were accepted. About half that 
number came to W.T.S.U. for 
their college work. 

Jane Tsai, a graduate student who 
will complete a Master's Degree in 
the Business field, has been at 
W.T.S.U. for two years. She came 
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from Taiwan and plans to return to 
the Republic of China and work in 
the management field. 

Chuig-Feu Chang (Sabrina), also 
from Taiwan, is a Fine Arts major. 
She has been at W.T.S.U. one year 
and is working towards a Master's 
degree. She was influenced in her 
choice of W.T.S.U. by Dr. Juanelle 
Rose of Tulia. 

Shau Cheu, another young lady 
from Taiwan, had arrived in the 
Texas Panhandle four days before 
her trip to Bovina. She said when she 
arrived she saw her first snow. 

Another young student just new to 
the Panhandle was Kebadire 
Mogoisi, who came from Botswana 
in southern Africa. She has been 
teaching horticulture in her home 
country and is here to study 
agriculture. 

Philomena Kuavnei is a beginning 
freshman student from Kenya. She 
is here to study the Social Sciences 
and do library work. 

These young ladies told of their 
homelands, families, hopes, aspira-
tions, and feeling towards the U.S. 
and the Panhandle. They warmed 
the hearts of all present with their 
friendliness and pleasant manners. 
There have to be great nations to 
have five young people such as these 
to represent them in a land not their 
own. 

Hostesses for the meeting were 
Mrs. Alrin Hartzog and Mrs. Jack 
Clayton. 

Members present were: Mrs. 
Rouel Barron, Mrs. Jack Clayton, 
Mrs. Joe Fowler, Mrs. Eugene  

VISIT STUDY CLUB....These five 
students are from the W.T.S.U. 
campus at Canyon and all are from 
foreign countries. They were here in 
Bovina to present a program to the 
Bovina Woman's Study Club last 
Thursday, January 11. They are 

Griffin, Mrs. Arlin Hartzog, Mrs. 
O.H. Jones, Mrs. Ovid Lawlis, Mrs. 
Reagan Looney, Mrs. Ronald 
Mlnyen, Mrs. Earl Richards, Mrs. 
C.B. Russell, Mrs. Earl Stevenson, 
Mrs. W.M. Sudderth, Mrs. George  
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from left to right: Chuig-Feu Chant, 
Taiwan; John H. Muthersbough,W 
Foreign Student Advisor at 
W.T.S.U; Kebadire Mogoisi, Bots-
wana; Jane Tsai, Taiwan; Philo; 
mena Kuavnel, Kenya; and Shau 
Cheu, Taiwan. 

Trimble, Mrs. Leon Ware, Mrs. Dick 411  
Richard, Mrs. H.D. Bradshaw and 
Mrs. Earl Whitten. 

Guests present were: Mrs: 
Bedford Caldwell and Rev. Dick 
Richards. 
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Scooter's Scoops 
By Scooter Russell 

Willis B. Hester, 62, of Texico, died 
last Thursday in Clovis. 

Services were held Thursday, 
January 12, in Steed Memorial 
Chapel with Dr. Carl Scott, pastor of 
Central Baptist Church officiating. 
Burial was in Sunset Memorial 
Gardens Cemetery at Farwell. 

Mr. Hester was born in Oklahoma 
and is survived by his wife, Polly. 

Pallbearers were: John McIntosh, 
Thomas Rhodes, Leon Ware, Jay 
Sherrill, Vernon Ward, Roy Love-
lady, Pete Davies and Harry J. 
Charles. 

+ + + + 
W.C. Mayhew, 66, of Douglas 

Ville, Georgia, died Monday, 
January 15, after a lengthy illness. 
Services will be tomorrow (Wednes-
day) in Douglas Ville. He is survived 
by his wife, Agnes, and four 
children. Services will be under the 
direction of the Whitley Funeral 
Home in Douglas Ville. 

Mayhew lived here with his family 
several years ago and was Mrs. 
Grady Hall's brother-in-law. 

+ + + + 
Marguerite Leavers of Alvo, 

Nebraska, celebrated her birthday 
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Sunday, in the home of her sister and 
brother-in-law, Maxine and Euell 
Hart of Bovina. Another sister, 

dinner 

Karla Mills 
Makes List 

Scooter 
t 
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Bookmobile 
Schedule 

slipped and fell on the icy sidewalk. 
She said they finished their 
shopping, came home and went to 
a doctor at Clovis. She had a chipped 
elbow and is having to wear her arm 
in a sling but is getting along fine. 

+ + + + 
Leslie and Rose McCain were 

guests of their son and daughter in 
law, Butch and Karen last Friday 
night in Amarillo. The couples 
enjoyed seeing "The Odd Couple" at 
the Country Squire Dinner Theater 
in Amarillo. 

+ + + + 
Mr. and Mrs. A.L. Nuttall and Rita 

hosted a wildgame dinner at their 
home Sunday afternoon. Main 
dishes of quail, dove, . pheasant, 
sandhill crane, deer and antelope 
were served. 

Attending from Bovina were C.E. 
and Charlie Trimble, Billy Don 
Read, Vernon Estes, Mr. and Mrs. 
M.H. Carson, Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Carson, Joan Carson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Bandy, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Russell, Mr. and Mrs. Mike Spears, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Lebby, Wayne 
Spears and Nick Trienen. 

Guests from Clovis were Mr. and 
Mrs. Pat Miner, Tessa, Melissa and 
Sabrina, Mr. and Mrs. Harold Ray 
Cast, Lori and Lisa, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jamie New and Shannon, Rick 
Switzer, Sharon Ward, Doug 
Harrison and Ted Hare. 

+ + + + 

It was announced this week by 
Lubbock Christian College that  
Karla Mills, a 1978 graduate of;   
Bovina High School, was one of the 
140 students that made the Dean's 
List at L.C.C. 

Miss Mills was one of the 16 
freshmen out of the total 48 students 
who made a perfect 4.0 grade s  
average. 	 'lb C. 

The High Plains Bookmobile will 
be in our area on the following 
dates: 
Wednesday, January 24--White-

face, 9:30-11 a.m.; Lehman, 11:05-
11:30 a.m.; Bledsoe, 12 noon-1:30 
p.m.; and Maple, 2:15-3:15 p.m. 

Thursday, January 25--West 
Camp, 9:15-10:15 a.m.; Lariat, 
10:30-11:30 a.m.; and Bovina, 12 
noon-3:30 p.m. 

Friday, January 26--Lums Chapel, 
10-10:45 a.m.; Spade, 12 noon-1:30 
p.m.; Hart Camp, 1:45-2:30 p.m.; 
and Fieldton, 2:45-3:30 p.m. 

Saturday, January 27--Olton, 
9:30-11:45 a.m.; and Amherst, 
1:15-3:30 p.m. 

IMO 

Plainview Art Show 
Accepts Applications 

Hazel Bowers, was also a 
guest in the Hart home. 

+ + + + 
Dorothy and Grady Sorley have 

recorded an album "Sweet 'N Easy" 
which is now on sale. 

It is a beautiful group of selections 
and the Sorleys did a tremendous job 
and if you don't have one you're 
missing a good one! 

We congratulate the Sorleys and 
are very proud of them. I am looking 
forward to their next album and 
hope there will be another one in the 
near future. 

They will present a concert 
Sunday night at 7:00 in the 
Fellowship Hall of the Baptist 
Church, followed by a time for 
autographing the albums and tapes, 
and a reception. 

Everyone is invited to come. 
+ + + + 

Selma Craig, 41, died after a short 
illness in a hospital in Torrance, 
California on Christmas Eve. 

She is survived by her husband, 
three sons, one daughter and her 
mother. 

She was Kenny and Matt Estes' 
mother and lived in Bovina several 
years ago. 

+ + + + 
Bessie Combs entered the hospital 

last week in Lubbock. She is in Room 
314 at St. Mary's Hospital. Suezy 
Smith said they were running tests 
yesterday and do not know how long 
she will remain in the hospital. 

Mrs. Combs lived in Bovina for 
several years and is now living with 
her daughter in Lubbock. 

+ + + + 
Mrs. Tom Griffith came home 

from the hospital last Thursday. She 
had been hospitalized for two weeks 
at Friona. 

Her husband, Tom, says she is 
doing pretty good now. 

+ + + + 
Last week, Harriet Lou Glasscock 

and her dad, Harry J., were 
shopping in Lubbock. As they were 
entering the Mall, Harriet Lou 

3r1 

All proceeds benefit Llano 
Estacado Museum and Plainview 
Rotary Club projects. 

All applications are submitted to a 
jurying committee. Deadline for a 
application is April 1. Anyone ur  
interested in receiving an applica-
tion should write to Rob Strong at 
Wayland College, Plainview, Texas 
79072. 

Applications for participation in 
the fifth annual Running Water 
Draw Arts and Crafts Festival are 
now being accepted, according to 
Festival director Rob Strong. The 
Festival will feature the hand-
crafted work of 125 artists and 
craftsmen on October 12, 13, and 
14th at the Hale County Agricultural 
Center in Plainview, Texas. 

4 

MR. and MRS. W.W. WILCOX....Mr. 
aid Mrs. W.W. (Bill) Wilcox will 
celebrate their 50th Wedding 
Anniversary with a reception 
Sunday, January 28 at the First 
Baptist Church of Bovina between 
the hours of 2 and 4 p.m. The couple 
was married January 27, 1929 at 
Moorewood, Oklahoma. They moved 
to Bovina in 1952 and now reside at 
702 4th Street. Hosting the event will 
be their children, Mr. and Mrs. Ike 

Courthouse 
Notes Wilcox and Mr. and Mrs. Philip 

Wilcox of Muleshoe, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Wilcox and Mr. and Mrs. 
Alan Ray Wilcox of Hereford, Mrs. 
June Sisco of Modesto, California, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Walters of Santa 
Barbara, California and Mr. and 
Mrs. Everett McCormick of Clovis, 
New Mexico. The couple also has 
twenty-one grandchildren and eight 
great-grandchildren. All friends and 
relatives are invited to attend. 

t 

4 

--Hospital Report-- 
PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL— 

Claude Osborn, Gertrude Allen, 
Olga Weaks, Sue Kent, Teresa 
Kendrick, Janie Villanueva and 
baby girl, A.V. Warren and Kevin 
Phelps. 

S 

Instrument Report Ending January 
3, 1979 in County Clerk Office, 
Bonnie Warren, County Clerk 

WD, A.W. Anthony, Jr., Dennis 
Wayne Anthony, Pt. S1/2  Sec. 36, 
T2N;R3E 

WD, A.W. Anthony, Jr., Linda 
Darlene Anthony, SE1/2  Sec. 26 and 
all SW1/2  Sec. 25, T2N;R3E 

WD, A.W. Anthony, Jr., Larry 
Eugene Anthony, W1/2  Sec. 26, 
T2N;R3E 

WD, Deon Awtrey, Kenneth R. 
Rogers, et al, 248.48 ac. out E-pt. 
Sec. 18, Blk. B, McMinn 

WD, Rocky Richards, Frank Roth, 
lots 27 and 28, Blk. 16, Farwell 

WD, Carl Davis, Miller Cunning-
ham, lot 27 and E 114 ft. lots 28 thru 
32, Blk. 2, Farwell. 

I 
t 

When you're 
in the 

market for 
HIGH INTEREST 

Look At The 
Credit Union's 

Money Market Certificate. 
*Minimum Deposit 10,000.00 

*Term Is 26 Weeks . 

*Insured Up To 40,000 By NCUA 

*Substantial Penalty For Early Withdrawals 

FRIONA TEXAS 

FEDERAL CREDIT UNION 

a 

ADMISSIONS— 
Maria Madrigal, Bovina; Diana 

Mendiaz and baby girl, Hereford; 
Vera Niavez, Summerfield; Janie 
Chavez and baby girl, Hereford; 
A.V. Warren, Farwell; Maria Polk, 
Friona; Thomas Mendoza, Bovina; 
Sue Kent, Friona; Olga Weaks, 
Friona; Janie Villanueva and baby 
girl, Bovina; Kevin Phelps, Clovis; 
Teresa Kendrick and baby boy, 
Friona. 

DISMISSALS— 
Olan Burchett, Christine Zorns, 

Paula Mauldin, Vera Niavez, Audie 
Lewis, Saundra Taylor, Diana 
Mendiaz and baby girl, Janie 
Chavez and baby girl, Mary Ruth 
Baird and baby boy, Sam Stanberry, 
Maria Madrigal, Thomas Mendoza, 
Murray Garnett and Maria Polk. 

fit  The power of the 
advertising dollar. 
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LUNCH MENU 
MONDAY—Spanish rice, but- 

I

,

tered corn, pork and beans, 
carrot sticks, cornbread, butter, 
peaches and Borden's milk. 

TUESDAY—Fried chicken, 
creamed potatoes and gravy, 

I
green beans, hot rolls, butter, 
fruit jello and Borden's milk. 

WEDNESDAY— Hamburgers,_
lettuce, onions, pickles, toma-
toes, mustard, tater tots, peanut 
butter cookies, peaches and 
Borden's milk. 
THURSDAY—Barbecue, pinto 

beans, potato salad, yeast 
cornbread, butter, apple cobbler 
and Borden's milk. 

la

FRIDAY—Tuna salad, candied I 
sweet potatoes, English peas, 
hot rolls, butter, pear halves and 
Borden's milk. 

POWERFUL DOLLARS! That's something 
every businessman is looking for. Dollars that get 
you the most return for the least investment. And 
that's what advertising is — an investment. Not an 
expense. 

The Advertising Department of the Bovina 
Blade is dedicated to seeing that you get the most 
return from your advertising dollar. No matter 
how big or small your ads may be, we'll work with 
you to get the most advertising power from your 
dollars. 

For wise ad investment counseling, call us 
today. 

THE BOVINA 
BLADE 

CALL 238-1523 
011111111114)41•11m 

Mr. and Mrs. Sonny Roach of, 
Bovina spent the weekend with theirvi 
son and his wife, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Roach of Lubbock. Sonny said they 
were proud of their son who took top 
trophy in the trap shoot held there. 

Jerry won the 200-target handicap 
division as well as the overall title at 
the South Plains Gun Club's two-day. 
shoot which wound up Sunday. 

Roach hit 179 in the handicap 
division. 

+ + + + 
I talked with Mr. L.L. Grissom 

(Tuesday) and he said his son, Leon, 
had surgery yesterday on his leg. 4 
Leon was injured a couple of weeks 
ago on his farm and is in the St. 
Ann's Hospital in Amarillo. 

+ + + + 
Thanks for calling 	 



Jerry Rockwell 

PLEASANT HILL 
EAPTIST CHURCH 

Sunday School-10: 30 a.m. 
Texas Time; 

Morning Worship, 11:30 a.m. 
Texas Time; 

Church Training, 7 p.m. 

Texas Time; 

Evening Worship, 8 p.m. 

Texas Time; 

Wednesday Night Meeting-8 p.m. Phillip Shelton 

OKLAHOMA 
LANE 

METHODIST 
CHURCH 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

Rev. H.L. Whittenburg 

CHARLES 
OIL COMPANY 

* Tires * Batteries * Accessories 

BOVINA BLADE PARMER COUNTY 
SPRAYING SERVICE 

Ph, Tharp 225-4990 

AGRI-SPRAYERS, INC. 
Quality Aerial Spraying 

Ph. 238-1475 

BOVINA 
CHURCH 

Of CHRIST 
SUNDAY SERVICES 
Classes-9:45 a.m. 
Worship-10:45 a.m. and 6 p.m. 
WEDNESDAY 
Devotional and Classes-8:30 p.m. 

Lee Clark 

ST. JOHN 
LUTHERAN 
CHURCH 

Sunday School-9: 30 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10: 30 a.m. 

Rev. Herman Schelter 

MISSION 
BELEN BA UTIS TA 

Escuela Dominical-9: 45 a.m. 
Mensaje-11: 30 a.m.-Union De 
Pre Preparacion-5 p.m. Mier- 
eoies Estudlo De La Biblia-7: 30 p.m. 
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Stop Smoking Now! FOR GSPA  

Anthony Elected 
Regional Director 

STATISTICS SHOW IT'S NOT 
TOO LATE; FORMER SMOKERS 
REAP CIRCULATORY BENEFITS 

By Jay R. McDanel, Ph.D. 
Tarleton State University 
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added risk of coronary disease over 
nonsmokers. Thus, the danger does 
not appear to persist if the smoking 
is stopped. A direct cause-and-effect 
relationship between cigarette 
smoking and the presence of 
coronary artery disease has not 
been definitely established, but 
cigarette smoking (by increasing 
the heart's oxygen demands) 
increases the frequency of chest 
pain, heart attack, and sudden death 
in patients who already have 
coronary heart disease. 

Are you overworking your heart? 

BTB•••• 
Anthony, Jr., Friona; Robert Green, 
Hartley; K.B. Parish, Springlake; 
and J.B. Cooper, Jr., Roscoe. 
Melvin Barton of Dimmitt is not 
pictured. 

Did you know that the nicotine 
contained in cigarettes causes an 
increase in heart rate and elevation 
of the blood pressure? Therefore, 
cigarette smoking increases the 
work of the heart and the demands 
of the heart muscle for oxygen. Also, 
the carbon monoxide in cigarette 
smoke combines with blood hemo-
globin and reduces its capacity to 
carry oxygen. 

NEW DIRECTORS....Five regional 
directors were elected to represent 
the Texas Plains Region of Grain 
Sorghum Producers Association. 
Shown, left to right, are A.W. 

Grissom 
)fl, Leon, 
his leg.  

)f Weeks 
the St. 

1 

production area. The five-state area 
is divided into eight regions which 
are composed of 36 districts. 
Farmer members elect officers and 
representatives from the county, 
district, region and national level. 

The GSPA National Board Annual 
Meeting will be February 1-2 at the 
Dallas-Ft. Worth Airport Marina 
Hotel, Dallas, Texas. 

(Continued from Page 1) 

that firemen could become intoxi-
cated from the fumes when they use 
it to put out a fire? 

"The 'Friends of the World' said 
they had obtained a sample of 
WATER and found it made clothes 
shrink. If it did this to cotton, what 
would it do to people? 

"In the House of Commons, the 
Home Secretary was asked if he 
would prohibit the manufacture and 
storage of this lethal new material. 
A full investigation was needed he 
replied, and the Major Hazardous 
Group would be asked to report." 

The consumption of twenty or more 
cigarettes daily is associated with 
a higher risk of having a heart 
attack (about three times that in 
nonsmokers). The risk of a heart 
attack is much less in pipe nicotine, 
but recent evidence indicates that 
the risk in these individuals is still 
greater than in nonsmokers. One 
must conclude that abstention from 
cigarettes can improve longevity in 
many individuals, although it is 
gratifying that the available data 
indicate that former cigarette 
smokers experience little if any 

that. GSPA was founded in 1956 as a 
non-profit organization to promote 
the use of grain sorghum, improve 
farm legislation, prevent surpluses, 
develop worldwide markets and 
improve the quality of sorghum 
through research. 

The national organization is 
headquartered in Lubbock, Texas, 
center of the grain sorghum 
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approved at the Region III meeting 
and will be presented to the National 
Board. The recommendations are 
that GSPA: 

(1) Work for "parity of income" 
and use cost of production with a fair 
return for management and capital 
as the basis for achieving it through 
government programs, sales prices, 
etc.; 

(2) Promote an extentied loan, 
(reserve program), in which the 
farmer's minimum release price 
would not be below the full cost of 
production, plus accrued charges 
and a 15 per cent profit; and 

(3) Support the general concept of 
the new Federal Crop Insurance 
Program as presented to Congress 
last fall by USDA. The National 
Board should, however, carefully 
watch the development of the law to 
see that producers' interests are 
maintained. 

Grain sorghum promotion has 
been left up to the producer, and 
Grain Sorghum Producers Associa-
tion is an organization of grain 
sorghum farmers who are doing just 

A Friona man was one of the five 
directors elected to represent the 
Texas Plains Region of Grain 
Sorghum Producers Association. 
A.W. "Dub" Anthony is a veteran 
GSPA Director. He has served 
the organization for 20 years, the 
last ten as its president. He also 
promotes grain sorghum as a 
director of U.S. Feed Grains 
Council. 

The Texas Plains Region, (Region 
III), is composed of the High Plains 
and Rolling Plains areas. There are 
approximately two thousand GSPA 
members in this region which 
produces 15 per cent of the nation's 
grain sorghum. 

In a December meeting, county 
and district representatives elected 
A.W. Anthony, Jr., Friona; Robert 
Green, Hartley; K.B. Parish, 
Springlake; J.B. Cooper, Jr., 

4 	Roscoe; and Melvin Barton, of 
Dimmitt as their Regional Direc-
tors. The Regional Directors from 
eight regions in a five-state area 
make up the National GSPA Board.. 

Three recommendations were 
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Bovina Churches Welcome You! Church Chuckles by CARTWRIGHT 

4 	• Church Page Sponsors 
ATTEND CHURCH 

REGULARLY! 

DUDLEY'S AUTO 
AUTO PARTS 

'3rd & Dimmitt Highway Ph. 238-1219 
Dudley & Jane Hughes 

OKLAHOMA 
LANE 

BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

FIRST 
BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Of BOVINA • 

Llano 
dnview Sunday School-10 a.m. 

Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. 

Sunday School-9: 45 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Training Union-6 p.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting- 

8: 30 p.m. 
Rev. Moody Smith 

ted to a 
ne for 
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pplica 
ong at 
Texas FIRST STATE BANK 

Of Bovina 
MEMBER FDIC "Afraid we must remove you from visitation work, 

Miss Grimes. We've gained 10 men, but we've 
lost 15 women!" LAWLIS GIN 

COMPANY 
Highway 86 Our Guide 

BOVINA 
METHODIST 

CHURCH 
It Sunday School-9: 45 a.m. 

Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
M.Y.F.-6 p.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 
Choir Practice-
Wednesday-8 p.m. 

Rev. Dick Richards KERBY . 
WELDING SERVICE 

ALI Deal The Year 0 

PAUL JONES 
TEXACO 

Firestone Tires 

promise to follow me 
faithfully." Needless to 
say he promised to follow 
the authorized guide and 
was delivered safely 
through the treacherous 
mountains to the other 
side. 

Many today find it 
difficult to find their way 
through the treacherous 
mountains of life. They 
have opportunity to follow 
many paths that only lead 
to confusion and frustra-
tion. There Is an au-
thorized guide, however, 
that extends His arms and 
says "Follow me." That 
guide is Christ and his 
teachings. We are guar-
anteed to be delivered 
safely to the other side if 
we follow Him faithfully. 

Lee Clark 
Minister 

Church Of Christ 

A man who was about to 
take a perilous journey 
through the mountains, 
was given not a little 
advice. As is often the 
case in such situations, 
the advice was contradic-
tory. One warned him 
against taking any of the 
by paths that led away 
from the main road, while 
others declared that 
many of these paths could 
be pursued with profit, 
since they meant shorten-
ing the distance toward 
his destination. So it was 
with a number of things 
that left him in doubt. "It 
seems," he said to 
himself, "I shall have to 
guess at what I do not 
know." Just then one 
appeared and said "I am 
the authorized guide. I am 
ready to go with you all 
the way, if you will 

GATEWAY FARMS 
BOVINA, TEXAS 

SOUTHSIDE 
MOTOR SUPPLY 

Dimmitt Road 	Ph. 238-1427 

BOVINA PUMP CO. 
Highway 86 - West 

ST. ANN'S 
CATHOLIC 
CHURCH 

Mass-Sunday, 8:30 a.m. 
CCD—After Mass Sunday 
Confession: Sunday, 8-8:25 a.m. 
Rev. John F. McGovern, S.A. 

Pastor 

FRIONA FORD SALES 
"Your Parmer County Ford Dealer" 

Bovina 	Ph. 238-1395 

PARMER COUNTY 
IMPLEMENT COMPANY 

W. Hwy. 60 Friona, Tex Ph. 247-2721 

Rev. John F. McGovern 
DONS MEDICINE CHEST 

Prescription & Health Needs 
Ph. 238-1659 

SHERRILL 
LUMBER COMPANY 

Highway 60 - Bovina 

Attend Church 
Regularly 

HORN-CLAYTON 
INSURANCE 

ALL TYPES OF INSURANCE 

BOVINA GIN COMPANY 
"Your Satisfaction 

Is Our First Concern" 

REEVE CHEVROLET--OLDS 
"Your Transportation Counselors 

Since 1938" 

SHERLEY GRAIN COMPANY 
"Serving Parmer County Farmers 

The Year Around" 

BOVINA 
PENTECOSTAL 

HOLINESS 
CHURCH 

Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

Rev. Wilburn Stone 
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Wt.,  d Ads, first Insertion, per word 	. 8 cents 
Adoitional Insertion'. (no copy change), 
per word ,, 	 . 	.. 6 	Pnts 

rr cm ( harp 	 91.25 

Classified display (boxed ads) 1 column or 2 
column width. Per column inch 	 61.25 
Cards of Thanks—same as classified word rate, 
minimum charge 	 $1.25 

Check advertisement and report any error 
immediately; The Blade is not responsible for 
error after ad has already run once. 

DEADLINE for classified advertising 
V 	Wednesday's issue—Noon Tuesday. 	 in  II  

1%  RE-ELECTED....State Representa-
tive Bill Clayton of Springlake was 
elected to a record third term as 
speaker of the Texas House of 
Representatives this week in Austin. 
Clayton won election without any 
organized opposition. He has served 
as representative for this district 
since 1962. 

IM WORKING LIKE MAD ON 
YOUR CASE I 

AGRI-BUILDER 

FOR RENT....Trailer spa- 
ces. Langer Trailer Park, 
corner of Boyce and Avenue 
I. Call 238-1294: 	9-tfnc 

BUILDINGS 
GRAIN STORAGE 

IDEAL STEEL 
CLOVIS, N.M. 
(505) 769-1941 

17-tfac See Us And SAVE 
142 MILES A VE. HEREFORD, TEXAS 

PHONE 364-0990 

KEEP THAT 
GREAT GM FEELING 

WITH GENUINE GM PARTS 

GM GM QUALITY 
SERVICE/PARTS 

GENERAL MOTORS PARTS DIVISION 

066<13 
DO YOU KNOW A CHILD 

WITH A HANDICAP? 
In One Minute You May 

Change a Lifetime 
Every handicapped child, from ages 3 through 21, has the right to a 
free public education. It's a state law, but many people are un-

aware of this fact. 

If you know a handicapped child who is NOT receiving appropriate 

educational services, 

Call Collect 

806-376-7463 
or complete Et return the Referral Form below. 

Region XVI Education Service Center can assist in obtaining the 
appropriate services for a handicapped child. Referral Et- Resources 
can be provided through the Direction Service Component. Certain 
Supportive Services in cooperation with your local school district 

can be provided by the Direct Service Component. 

Please take one minute of your time to either fill out the attached 

form, call the above phone number, or contact the Special Educa-
tion Director of your local school. 

REFERRAL FORM 

Name of Child   Age 	 

Name of Parent/ Guardian _ 

Mailing Address 	  

City 	Zip 	Phone ( 

Name of Person Making Referral 	  

Telephone of Person Making Referral ( 
(By law, all information is held in strict confidence) 

Mail Referral Form to: 
Region XVI Education Service Center 

Attn: Special Education Director 

P. 0. Box 30600 • Amarillo, TX 79120 
Title VI B Education of the Handicapped Act 

Examinations will be given in the 
survey's mobile Health Examina-
tion Center, which will be located on 
the parking lot of the Bell and Kettle 
Restaurant, Route 60 (adjacent to 
Sands Motel), Bovina, Texas, 
Transportation to and from the 
Center will be provided to 
participants at no cost. 

In addition to a general 
examination and laboratory work-
up, participants will be tested for 
heart and lung conditions, hearing, 
nutrition, diabetes, hypertension, 
arthritis, and kidney disease. The 
tests will be administered by the 
U.S. Public Health Service staff 
consisting of physicians, nurses, 
technicians, and nutritionists. 

Since the first survey in this 
program was undertaken 15 years 
ago, more than 40,000 Americans of 
all ages have participated volun-
tarily. The information obtained 
through their cooperation has 
provided national statistics on the 
extent of conditions such as heart 
disease, diabetes, and arthritis in 
the United States and on many IS 
facets of human growth and 
development. The data is used in 
medical research and education as 
well as in planning national health 
programs. 

• 

Her chances 
of dying 
from a 
heart attack 
or stroke 
are 50-50. 

So are yours. 
American 

T Heart 
Association 
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New M-x 

Election 
Slated 

The Board of Directors of 
the High Plains Under-
ground Water Conservation 
District No. 1 has announced 
that Saturday, January 20, 
is to be election day for 
electing two members to the 
District Board and fourteen 
(14) County Committeemen. 

Webb Gober, the current 
Board President, will be 
running unopposed for his 
Board position from Direc-
tor's Precinct Three, which 
is composed of the Water 
District service area in 
Bailey, Castro and Parmer 
Counties. Voting for Board 
members is done "at-large" 
throughout the Precinct 
Three area. 

In Parmer County the 
County Committeemen are 
to be elected from Commis-
sioner's Precincts One and 
Two. The candidate in 
Precinct One is Floyd Reeve 
and in Precinct Two is 
Ralph Roming. Voters may 
vote only for the candidate 
for the precinct in which 
they reside. 

Voting will take place at 
the County Courthouse in 
Farwell, City Hall in Bovina 
and the Fire Station in 
Friona. All polling places 
will be open from 7 a.m. 
until 7 p.m. 

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE 
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FOR SALE....Maroon 1975 
Dodge Dart Sport, air 
conditioning. 965-2949, 965- 
2893 after six. 	18-tfnc 

WANT TO BUY....3 bed-
room, 2 bath home. Good 
condition. Call T-Bone Trie- 
nen, 238-1614. 	26-tfnc 

Civil Cases Set 
For Court Docket 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Lee J. 

Bowers wish to express 
their gratitude to the many 
friends and neighbors who 
gave comfort during the 
time of bereavement 
through sympathy and acts 
of kindness. Special thanks 
is extended to all donors 
of floral tributes and food. 

Mrs. Hazel E. Bowers 
26-1tp 

nan, Christian Drager, Evelyn Ann 
Ball, April Suzanne Coker, Wilfred 
Quickel, Amos Edward Steelman, 
Jerry Donald Stone and Winston 
Irvin Allison. 

Also, Orville Lee Beavers, Jr., 
W.L. Cleveland, Tommy Joe 
Franks, Salas Jane Mendoza, 
Wanda Naomi White, Violet Jenine 
Foster, Manuel J. Rodriquez, Jr., 
Stephen Wayne Pierson, Dora Belle 
Ivy, Alvin Glasscock, Lenda Lue 
Trussell and Mary Lee Cass. 

Also, Ernesteen Skipworth, Ada-
beth Smith, Ione Hickman, Dwight 
Woodrow Whitaker, Sarah Jane 
Stephens, Amy Hromas, Conny Dale 
Dodson, John Thomas Caldwell, 
Erma Inez Tunnell, Donna Colleen 
Smith, Sharon Sue Rector and 
Gloria Jane Wallis. 

The Lonely Heart 

Seven civil cases have been 
scheduled for District Court begin-
ning on Monday, January 22 in 
Farwell. 

A list of 114 petit jurors have been 
summoned by Sheriff Charles 
Lovelace for the court session, with 
72 to report Monday at 1:30 p.m. and 
42 slated for duty on Wednesday, 
January 24, at 9:30 a.m. 

Cases on the docket include: 
Civil cases: 1. J.T. Mayfield, et al 

vs Weathermaster Seeds, Inc. et al; 
2. Herbert Day et al vs Freightliner 
Corp vs Allis-Chalmers et al; 3. R.L. 
Stone Construction Co., Inc. vs Kelly 
Green Seeds. 

4. Panhandle Fire & Equipment, 
Inc. vs Les Fithen; 5. Andrew Henry 
Wilson vs Texas Employers; 6. 
Jesus Barbara Espinoza vs Com-
mercial Union Insurance Co.; 7. St. 
Paul's Insurance Co. vs George 
Irwin. 

Jurors who have been summoned 
include: 

Tommy Lee Tatum, Mrs. A.P. 
Sutton, Jack Robinson Hamil, Erma 
Lou Brownd, Betty LaVelle Lillard, 
Edwina Davenport, Floyd Robert 
Schueler, Roy Donald Hall, Ruth 
Irene Drager, Cora Ruth Snyder, 
JoLounell Kelm and Ann Eva 
Caldwell. 

Also, Billy Joe Weir, Virginia 
Rhodes, Pearl Mourine Murry, 
Gregg K. Hromas, Norman Ray 
Taylor, Dale Ann Counce, Othelia 
Bennett, Angela Dolores Forrester, 
Harold Dewayne Sexton, Juan 
Samorron and Glenda Jay Jennings. 

Also, Laverne W. Parr, Petra 
Martinez, Roy Virgil Miller, Jack 
Williams, Judy Irene Rhodes, Floyd 
Scott Reeve, Hope Shuman, Larry 
Kim Parr, Marilyn Denise Jones, 
Eddie Royce Matthews and Eddie 
Ramm. 

Also, Glendel Leon London, 
Stafford Bradshaw, Norvin Preston, 
Jewell Cummings, Elsie Jo Bucha- 

Need a better Band Instru-
ment? Good Selection now. 
New and Used. Expert 
Repairs. Phillips House of 
Music, 118 Main in Clovis, 
N.M. Phone 505-763-5041. 

1-tfnc 

YORK BIN & BUILDING 
DEALER WANTS ASSO-
CIATE DEALERS. Here's a 
method to buy your next Bin 
or Building at near cost. For 
further information. Call 
Bob Roberts collect 806-737- 
3650. 	 26-1tp 

To report emergencies or 
any suspicious activity, any 
time of the day, call the 
Marshal, 238-1133 night, 
holidays or weekends, 238-
1133; or Deputy Marshal, 
238-1190; If no answer, call 
Sheriff's department, 806-
481-3303. When none of these 
respond, call County Deputy 
Sheriff Henry Minter at 
238-1393. 	 8-tfnc 

• .4 • • 	• • ••••• • 're. • • ••••• • 	• • -••••• • ...sr•••• 
I'm your Mary Kay' I:  
Beauty Consultant. Call f 

me for all your beauty 
needs. Earlene Jordan, • 
247-2537. 	1-tfnc 
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B. Clayton 
Re-Elected 

As Speaker 

Wednesday, January 24, 1979 
E.L. Fairchild, Blanca Hilda 

Anzaldua, James Robert Robinson, 
Nicanor Rodriquez, Monty Keith 
Corbin, Kenneth Johnson, Juan 
Buentello, Nellie Beatrice Ray, 
Marnita Martinez, Alvin Ray Jordan 
and Bessie Webb. 

Also, Annie Lorene Derrick, 
Travis Albert Lillard, Thomas L. 
Shelton, LeReta Dell Barber, Dana 
Jay Harris, Vera Beth Thompson, 
Royce Joe Stanton, Brenda Sue 
Smith, Mrs. Stanley Benge, Harold 
Dean McCallum, Mina Sheets and 
Carolla Smith. 

Also, Jesse Thomas Coburn, M.A. 
Snider, Jr., Mary Lou Trevino, Troy 
B. Hutson, Charles Edward Trim-
ble, James William Eubank, 
Durward Bell, Gayle Jean Murdock, 
and Doris Ferguson. 

Also, Minnie Tola Parham, Deon 
A. McGee, Patsy Ruth Gresham, 
Ranza B. Boggess, Jr., Kathy 
Boozer, George Martinez, Beatrice 
Gonzalez, James Von Edelmon and 
Martha Ivah Allen. 

Stagner-Orsborn 

Buick - Pontiac - GMC 
30 YEARS IN HEREFORD 

In 
1111 • Ja sc 

su 
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— 	0 0 0 0110 00 000 — 4 FOR SALE 
For Country Living, or a 
place in town—I have a 
listing that would make 
fine residences for any-
one. 
FOR SALE....Nice three 
bedroom brick home on 20 
acres of land with 
four-inch well on electri-
city. Priced to sell. 

JACK WOLTMON 
Real Estate 

Phone 238-1242 
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Public Health Unit 
Begins Work Locally 

A team of U.S. Public Health 
Service personnel will be in Bovina 
from now through March 1, 1979 to 
conduct the Health and Nutrition 
Examination Survey, designed to 
gather valuable statistical informa-
tion on the health of the American 
people. 
The survey, a program of the 

National Center for Health Statis-
tics, is part of a continuing national 
program first authorized by Con-
gress in 1956. 

tAmerican 
Heart 

. Association 

Over a three year period 28,000 
individuals, ages six months through 
74 years, will be asked to participate 
in the study. Bovina is one of the 65 
areas scientifically selected to 
produce a representative sample of 
the total population of the United 
States. 

Approximately 537 residents of 
Parmer County who fall into a 
statistically representative sample 
of the area, will be offered a free 
physical examination. Of these 537 
persons, 437 have already consented 
to the examination, the other 100 
persons will be visited again by the 
Public Health Service personnel so 
that they may have an opportunity 
to gain a thorough knowledge about 
the examination and its purpose. 

Representative Bill Clayton of 
Springlake became the first man in 
history to be elected to a third 
successive term as speaker of the 
Texas House of Representatives. 

Clayton's election was a highlight 
of the opening day's activities of the 
66th Legislature, and was more or 
less a foregone conclusion, since two 
other representatives who had at 
one time mentioned the speaker's 
position pulled in their horns and 
declined to run. 

The final vote on the speaker was 
137 votes for Clayton and eight 
against. 

In his first address to the 66th 
Legislature, Clayton said "I know 
we will face some of the hardest 
decisions ever. I know it will take a 
miracle to accomplish all we need in 
140 days, particularly in light of tax 
relief on one hand and additional 
services on the other. 

"But you know, I believe in 
miracles. We can overcome the 
doubt, overcome the pessimism, 
overcome the anxiety, and produce 
the miracle of accomplishment the 
people of this great state so rightly 
deserve," Clayton said. 

Only one other person in the 
history of Texas state government 
has served three terms as speaker of 
the House of Representatives, but 
they were not consecutive. M.D.K. 
Taylor of Bonham was speaker of 
the 1859, 1863 and 1873 sessions of the 
legislature. 

Clayton was first elected to the 
state legislature from the 74th 
district in 1962, to replace the 
retiring Jesse Osborn of Muleshoe. 
He has been re-elected every term 
since, and was first elected as 
Speaker of the House in 1975. 

Clayton is a life-long resident of 
this area, and farms in the 
Springlake area. 

A pleasure . . . 
and a challenge! 
That's the way Ben McMullin, PRINCIPAL 
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER for Southwestern Public 
Service, sees his job . . . his role in the boy 

scouts . . . and life! 

"You know, I've got some 30 years in scouting. I've done 
it all . 	workin' with the boys and the adult leaders. 
Looking back, I think the highlight in scouting for me was 
taking 11 boys to the National Jamboree in Idaho. Now 
that was an experience! It's been a pleasure . and a 
challenge Same as my job at SPS. I'm the Principal 
Structural Engineer in charge of the power plant group 

. . that's the steel and concrete that holds up the place, 
you might say. It's very exacting work. We combine past 
experiences with research on new and better materials 
and products . .trying to make the next power plant we 
build more efficient than the last one. It's a real chal- 
lenge but that's what it's all about 	keeping the costs 
down for everybody. I've been at it 25 years now and I'm 
glad to be part of that team. We're doing the job we set 
out to do 

491S.4.4-4 
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SPS has encouraged me in my job and in all my civic activities. 
You bet I'm proud to work for SPS . . and for my community. For 
me, it's hard to imagine one without the other." 

A 

93o 



There's no such thing as 
esudded heart attack. 

It only seems that way. To the victims. And to their families. 
But in reality, most heart attacks are the result of a slowly 

developing disease process called "atherosclerosis" that narrows and 
roughens arteries with fatty deposits. When severely affected, a blood 
clot can form in the artery and block it. If this happens in one of the 
arteries that nourish the heart muscle, the result is a heart attack. 

There are simple things you can do to effectively improve your 
chances of avoiding heart trouble. 

Don't Smoke. A man who smokes more than a pack a day has 
nearly twice as much risk of heart attack as a non-smoker. 

Have Your Blood Pressure Checked. High blood pressure is often 
the underlying cause of both strokes and heart attacks. If you haven't 
had your pressure checked in the past year, get it tested now., 

Lose Weight. Every pound of fat you carry around is an added 
strain on your heart. If you're overweight, go to your doctor. He can 
help you safely reduce. 

Eat Properly. Whether you're overweight or not, if your choles- 
terol level is abnormally high, your chances of having heart trouble 
increases dramatically. You can avoid this danger by maintaining a 
balanced diet that is low in saturated fats and cholesterol. 

Get Fit, and Stay Fit. If you don't exercise regularly, you're 
weakening your heart. And you're needlessly endangering yourself. 
Your doctor can devise an exercise program that's right for your 
age and health situation. 

Have Regular Medical Checkups. Only your doctor can determine 
your general health and heart condition. Regardless of how healthy 
you think you are, you should still see your doctor at least once a year 
for a thorough examination. 

These are the steps you can take to reduce the risk of heart 
attack. Now it's up to you. So take a good long look at 'yourself, and 
the way you live. And remember. There's no such thing as a "sudden" 
heart attack. 

Just sudden tragedies. 

American Heart Association 
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Teams Sweep Kress; 
Then Lose To S-E 

Ada. 

Jane  try 
Dale 
Well, 
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and 

The Bovina High School Mustangs 
and Fillies opened their district play 
against Kress last Tuesday, January 
9. Both the Mustangs and Fillies 
came away with wins at the end of 
the night. 
The Mustangs, led by Del Ray 

Sudderth's 23 points, beat the Kress 
Kangaroos, 65-53. There were three 
other players for the Mustangs that 
scored in double figures, and they 
were Mike Read, Ronnie Cary and 
Harvey Shepherd. 

The Fillies beat the Rooettes in a 
lopsided game, 55-28. The Fillies 
were able to put on an impressive 
show with the help of a very 
balanced scoring attack. 
In action Friday, January 12, the 

Mustangs and Fillies were upset by 
the teams from Springlake-Earth. 
The Bovina teams were hampered 
by poor shooting throughout the 
right and both teams lost by narrow 
margins. 

The Mustangs lost to the 
Wolverines, 54-48, and the Fillies 
dropped their game, 39-37. 

+ + + + 
BOX SCORES 

MUSTANGS 16 38 46 65 
Kress 	13 	33 	41 	53 

D. Sudderth 23, Cary 14, Read 10, 
Shepherd 10, Shelby 4, B. Sudderth 2, 
Quiroga 2. 

+ + + + 
FILLIES 10 26 41 55 
Kress 	5 	7 	11 	28 

Shelby 13, Williams 10, Moody 9, 
Sides 8, Read 7, Naegle 2, Chisom 2, 
Widner 2, Schilling 2. 

+ + + + 
MUSTANGS 9 21 38 48 
S-E 	 8 	19 	31 	54 

Shelby 21, Cary 9, Shepherd 8, 
Sudderth 4, Salazar 4, Read 2. 

+ + + + 
Fillies 	9 	17 	23 	37 
S-E 	 12 	17 	32 	39 

Sides 17, Moody 7, Read 6, Nix 4, 
Widner 2 Nae le 1 

Mustangs won the game, 65-53. 11115 
was the first district game for the 
Mustangs who are now 1-1 in district 

DEL RAY SUDDERTH....Goes up 
br two of his twenty-three points 
against the Kress Kangaroos. The 

Hilda 
Ism% 
Keith 
Juan 
Ray, 

1rdan I• 

Jr. Teams 
Win Three 

Fillies won the game easily, 55-28. 
The Fillies are also 1-1 in district 
clay after losing to Springlake-
Earth, 37-39. 

SUR ROUNDED....Elyese Moody 
(41) goes up for a Jump-shot against 
he Kress Rooettes despite being 
surrounded by Kress players. The 
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Jr. Meet Success 

UMW 
TREASURER'S 

REPORT M.A. 
Troy 
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iv 
REPORT of Benna Felts, County Treasurer of Farmer 

County, Texas, of Receipts and Expenditures from Oct. 1st, 
1978 to Dec. 31st 197? inclusive: Dean 

ham, 
:achy 
trice 
and 

The Bovina Junior High School 
Invitational Tournament was held 

• January 11-13, and according to 
school officials, the tourney was a 
success. 
The winners of the Boys Division 

were: Dimmitt, first; Muleshoe, 
second; Bovina, third; Hart, fourth; 
and Friona, fifth. 

The winners in the Girls Division 
were: Hart, first; Muleshoe, 
second; Farwell, third; Dimmitt, 
fourth; and Bovina, fifth. 
Congratulations to all the teams 

for their fine play, especially the 
winners in each division. Congratu-
lations also to the Bovina teams for 
the fine play during the tourney. 

THURSDAY'S GAMES 
Girls Division: Farwell 36, Bovina 

7th 9; Friona 12, Muleshoe 29; 

Dimmitt 18, S-E 15; Hart 33, Bovina 
8th 18. 

The Bovina Junior High School 
basketball teams traveled to Kress 
Nbnday, January 8, and came away 
with three wins, and one loss. 

The eighth grade boys won, 22-18; 
the eighth grade girls won, 20-14; 
and the seventh grade boys won, 
24-18. The only loss of the night was 
suffered by the seventh grade girls, 
41-6. 

+ + + + 
BOX SCORES 

Rh Boys 	4 	14 	14 	22 
Kress 	2 6 12 18 

Gilbreath 9, Steelman 5, McClaran 
3, Riddle 2, Spring 2. 

+ + + + 
8th Girls 	2 	10 	16 	20 
Kress 	4 8 10 14 

L. Shepherd 14, Bentley 4, Ortiz 2. 
+ + + + 

7th Boys 	5 	7 	22 	24 
Kress 	4 	8 	14 	18 

Gomez 8, Wilson 5, Clayton 5, 
Shepherd 4, Griggs 2. 

+ + + + 
7th Girls 	0 	4 	6 	6 
Kress 	12 	18 	31 	41 

Cupit 4, Whitecotton 2. 

JURY FUND. 1st Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 $560.40 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 1,958.25 
Cancelled Checks 	 70.00 
To Amount transferred from other Funds, since last Report, 

From General 	 1,000.00 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "A," 	1,650.00 
Balance 	 1,938.65 

ROAD AND BRIDGE FUND. 2d Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 76.78 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 1,958.23 
To Amount transferred from other Funds, since last Report, 

From General 	 1,000.00 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "B," 	750.00 
Balance 	 2,285.01 

GENERAL COUNTY FUND. 3d Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	49,820.61 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 196,216.21 
Salary Receipts 	 57,302.01 
Salary Disbursements 	 45,30327 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "C," 	215,745.58 
By Amount transferred to other Funds, since last Report, 

Trs, to R & B 

Boys Division: Farwell 16, Bovina 
7th 38; Friona 20, Muleshoe 30; 
Dimmitt 23, S-E 19; and Hart 31, 
Bovina 8th 38. 

FRIDAY'S GAMES 
Girls Division: (Championship 

Group) Farwell 13, Muleshoe 21; 
(Consolation Group) Hart 18, 
Dimmitt 10; Bovina 7th 16, Friona 
20. 
Boys Division: (Championship 

Group) Bovina 7th 26, Muleshoe 33; 
Dimmitt 34, Bovina 8th 30; 
(Consolation Group) Farwell 17, 
Friona 26; S-E 22, Hart 35. 

SATURDAY'S GAMES 
Girls Division: (Championship 

Game) Hart 36, Muleshoe 16; (3rd 
Place Game) Farwell 24, Dimmitt 
19; (Consolation Game) Bovina 8th 
29, Friona 14. 
Boys Division: (Championship 

Game) Dimmitt 38, Muleshoe 26; 
(3rd Place Game) Bovina 7th vs 
Bovina 8th--did not play; (Consola-
tion Game) Hart 34, Friona 23. 
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HIGH SCORER....Sandi Sides (44) 
shoots for two of her 17 points 
against the Springlake-Earth girls. 
Karen Schilling (50) starts toward 
the basket in case Miss Sides 
missed. The Fillies dropped the 
game to S-E, 3749. 4- 
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Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone (806) 421-3288 or 481-9149 
"Sales And Loans Are Our Service" 

LICENSED 
Office Time-9 a.m.-5 p.m. Monday through Friday 

Saturday-By Appointment 

4 

Ag  

SPECIAL OF THE WEEK 

1,000.00 
Trs. to Jury 	 1,000.00 
Trs. to Soc/Sec 	 2,R21 22 

Balance 	 37,466.76 
PERMANENT IMPROVEMENT FUND. 4th Class 

Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 2,192.55 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 1,958.24 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "D" 	457.75 
Balance 	 3,693.04 

RIGHT OF WAY FUND. 5th Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 4,732.33 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 175,808.57 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "E" 	170,000.00 
Balance 	 10,540.90 

LATERAL FUND. 6th Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	28,493.46 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 NONE 
By Amount paid out since last Report; Ex. "F" 	13,785.72 
Balance 	 14,707.74 

SOCIAL SECURITY FUND. 7th Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 2,273.56 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 6,247,50 
To Amount transferred from other Funds, since last Report, 

From Farm to Mkt. 	 2,224.60 
From General 	 2,823.22 

By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "G" 	10,105.28 
Balance 	 3,463.60 

FARM TO MARKET FUND. 8th Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	35,074.93 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 113,815.92 
To Amount transferred from other Funds, since last Report, 

From Rev/Sharing 	 20,529.74 
By Amount paid out since last Report, Ex. "H" 	128,248.59 
By Amount transferred to other Funds, since last Report, 

To Soc/Security 	 2,224.60 
Balance 	 38,947.40 

REVENUE SHARING FUND. 9th Class 
Balance last Report, Filed Sept. 30, 1978 	 2,279.74 
To Amount received since last Report, 	 18,250.00 
By Amount transferred to other Funds, since last Report, 

Trs. to Fm/Mkt 	 20,529.74 
Balance 	 NONE 

RECAPITULATION 
JURY FUND, BALANCE 
ROAD AND BRIDE FUND BALANCE 
GENERAL COUNTY FUND BALANCE 
PERM/IMPROVEMENT FUND BALANCE 
RIGHT of WAY FUND BALANCE 
LATERAL FUND BALANCE 
SOCIAL SECURITY FUND BALANCE 
FARM to MARKET FUND BALANCE 
REV/SHARING FUND BALANCE 
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Notice: Airplane lovers and Spray 
Services-excellent hangars with air 
strip, many storage buildings with 110 A. 
irrigated on Hiway east of Muleshoe. 

+ + + + 
160 A. irrigated, $400 per A. on Highway 
near Bovina. 

+ + + + 

$4, 
240 A. irrigated lays real good. Pleasant 
Hill area. Priced for immediate sale.  

++++ 
299 A. irrigated 4 wells. Lays real good. 2 
bedroom house and barn. Good terms. 

++++ 
525 A. irrigated. 6 wells and tailwater 
pits with 2 bedroom hotfse and barn. 
Lays real good. Good terms. 

+ + 4- + 
Ideal ho 	aQQ approximately 6 
acres 	h h se a , ar 	hay barn 
and small a ture with ni e 2 edroom, 
1 bath hou)se;:!vithicarpet nd 	neling. 
Good-it/n(11s. 

>4; 

+ 	+ + 

Good location in the country, 5 acres 
with large 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick 
home with basement. Has 2 bedroom, 1 
bath garage apartment and quonset 
barn. 

+ + + 
190 Acres irrigated, 2 wells, touches 
Bovina's City Limits. 

+ + + + 

LIST OF BONDS AND OTHER SECURITIES 
CD's For: Farmer Co. Permanent School Fund 
Farmer Co. Available School Fund 
Parmer Co. General Fund 
Farmer County Right of Way 
Farmer Co. Farm to Market 
Parmer Co. Revenue Sharing 
Voter Registration Account (Special) 
Farmer County Indebtedness: None 

ON HAND 
805,400.00 
14,400.00 

175,000,00 
170,000.00 
117,000.00 

36,500.00 
1,620.48 

0 
0 

Extra large nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 
home with garage, good location, 1 block 
from school. 

0 
S 

+ + + + 
160 Acres, irrigated. One well with 
tailwater pit. Has nice 3-bedroom, 
1-bath house. South of Friona. 

+ + + + 
South of Farwell. 520 Acres, irrigated, 3 
circles, 2 with hay, good water area. 4 
wells. 
Savings Is Great-Invest In Real Estate 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF FARMER 

Before me, the undersigned authority, on this day 
personally appeared Benna Felts, County Treasurer of 1: 
Farmer County, who being by me duly sworn, upon oath, 
says that the within and foregoing report is true and correct. 

Benna Felts, County Treasurer.  
Sworn to and subscribed before me, this 8th day of January 
1979. 

EviefirmiswsrcNtroomr- N,rmiver.-Nix.K7,, my4* 1/4  - 

Bonnie Warren, Clerk 
County Court Partner County, Texas 

r 	-. :triT -55:24175TIAJL: ::".111.71An W" 47::v 



Discover 
ill b' WEEK'S 
KEY VALUE! 

METAL PHOTO 
FRAMES 57 
. Choice of 3 styles 
• 8x10 or 5x7-in. size 	 • each 

With Non-Glare Glass 	Reg. 
$359 /o $4.99 

• 
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PRICES GOOD WEEK OF JANUARY 18 THRU JANUARY 24 

$189  
$189  
$269  
$269  
15159  
45149  

I 	on 	No NIN ow 	 m• en am im sm 	EN no on mi EN so NE 	no mi NE im em •• si N. im im me on asi 	 EN me um ism NIN 	INN UN me mu 	NB mi EN I= Nil INN 	ME INN MN MN NE No on me  
ma 

82 	7-Oz. Family Size 
GLEEM TOOTHPASTE 

$1.21 eath without coupon 

.1 , 01  

Good only at BEN FRANKLIN 

VALUABLE COUPON 

Good only at BEN FRANKLIN 11111111111k 

VALUABLE COUPON 

MARGARINE 
La PKG.  49 c 

KRAFT PARKA Y 

BEN FRANKLIN 
We bring variety to life! 

with coupon 

1111 
	

1111 

H4  26 

III 

00 

66 

92 

Good only at BEN FRANKUN 

VALUABLE COUPON 

t7Eric9 

Plc! 99 0 

79c pack without coupon 

4-Pack 
BIC SHAVERS 

with coupon 

SOUTHERN BELLE 

PECAN PIECES 
6 OZ. PKG. 

$j19 

111111111 

CUCUMBERS 

RED EMPEROR JUICE 
GRAPES ) 	46 OZ. CAN 

LB. 49' 	
69c 

4547"4,,z7i, 

CALIFORNIA 

LONG LONG GREEN 

USDA CHOICE 	LOWER CUT 

MRS BAIRD'S 
Hot Dog Buns 

ME 
sie 

-IIulu.I 

MI Ole al MN IIIMI INN 	IIM NM 	In MIN MN NM MI OM Ell MIN I= =I IM 

FREEZER BEEF  
USDA CHOICE 	uSDA CHOICE 

HEIFERS STEERS 
LB. $1.16 	LB. '1.19 

FRonfOODALE 

• 

SI MI MI MI =I I= in OM I= In NM 	MI Mil In =I NM OM MO 	 IM MI I= 

SUNFRESH SLICED 1001. PKG. 3P1 STRAWBERRIES 
BIRDSEYE 	 10 OZ. PKG. 	4% 4% e 

CHOPPED BROCCOLI AIV'  

DOUBLE STAMPS 
ON WEDNESDAY Family Center 

WITH $2.50 PURCHASE OR MORE NOW OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE 

Donna Supermarket 
41 "BIG CITY SELECTIONS 

SMALL TOWN CONVENIENCE" 

Discover 

1 
PARKAY 

1Pico1 PEPSI 

, 

PEpsi  

UART SIZE 

PEPSI- 
COLA 

3201. BOTTLE 

4 p 1 0 0 

PLUS DEPOSIT 
A, 

BAN LOTION I-)  
ROLL-ON 
with coupon 	 

1-1/2-0z. 
Size ea. 

   

$1.21 each without coupon 

TOILET TISSUE 

CHILI 
SOFT 'N LITE 

FLOUR 

89c 

79 
59 
3/$1 

4 ROLL PKG. 

ASSORTED COLORS 

5 LB. BAG 

WOLF BRAND PLAIN 
NO BEANS 

15 01 CAN 

KOUNTY KIST WHOLE KERNEL 

GOLDEN CORN' AN 

lit 
ULTRA 
MAX 

shamix-,0 

ULTRA MAX 
SHAMPOO 

The shampoo that's 
specially formulated 
for blow dryer users! 
Regular or oily. 

05 
11 each 

BONUS PACK! 

3-Blank Tape 
CASSETTES 
Pkg. of three C-60 
blank cassette tapes. 
Fits any player or re-
corder. 

Ref 

Only 	P kg.  
4.49 

.07-Oz. Size 

INSTANT 
KRAZY CLUE 
Bonds in seconds! For 
metal, rubber, glass, 
ceramics, plastic. 

4.49 9(4P 
Only 	as. 

7-Oz. 
Size 

WELCH'S 

GRAPE JAM or 
JELLY ga 

20 OZ. JAR %. 

ALLEN'S CUT 

GREEN BEANS 4/ $ 
WITH POTATOES 	303 CAN 

LIBBY'S 

FRESH PRODUCE TOMATO 

ROUND STEAK LB. 

USDA CHOICE 

SIRLOIN STEAK LB. 

USDA CHOICE 

T-BONE STEAK LB. 
USDA CHOICE BONELESS 

CLUB STEAK LB. 

PIKES 
PEAK ROAST LB. 

USDA CHOICE 

RUMP ROAST LB. 

1.1‘... 	 _ • 1,11_1.— 

take the 
world's finest 
eatin' chicken 
home 
for dinner... 

147 

  

BROASTED 
CHICKEN 

Treat the whole 
family to our 
specialty. Golden 
brown, luscious 
Broasted Chicken. 

$329 

HOT FOODS 
EVERY DAY! 

  

  

   

BAR-B-QUE' 
CORN DOGS • 

FRENCH FRIES 
BURRITOS 

 

a- 	
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