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Hornets Turn Mistakes 
To Homecoming Win

Senior Gtizens New 
Housing Loan Gosed

1 *

READY FOR THE LOAN SIGNING... ..Wednesday afternoon, interested persons packed Norman Bays’ attorney’s office 
to close the loan with FHA for construction of a senior citizen housing complex in Muleshoe. Pictured are the persons who 
have worked on the project. From left, seated are Norman Bays, Mr. and Mrs. J.K. Adams, Mrs. Buck Creamer; 
standing from left are Lonnie Merriott, Texas Employment Commission; Buck Campbell, Housing Authority; Myron Pool 
111, Housing Authority; Bill Stewart, FHA; Jim Hartline, Muleshoe Housing Authority; Dorothy Scott, FHA; Jim Cox, 
Housing Authority; Bailey County Judge Glen Williams; Clinton Kennedy, FHA; Teresa Drewel, Whitaker and Hall; and 
Harmon Elliott, chairman, Muleshoe Housing Authority.

’80 Crop Production Down; 
Corn Up From Estimates

Although prices are up 
for cotton and corn this 
year, early predictions for 
yields on both crops have 
dropped in this county. 
With the prolonged drouth, 
Bailey County Extension 
Agent Spencer Tanksley 
has painted a rather dismal 
picture for prospects for 
this year in agriculture.

Lazbuddie Homecoming 
is scheduled for Friday, 
September 26.

Activities begin with a 
barbecue served both be­
fore and after the 8 p.m. 
football game against the 
Amherst Bulldogs.

All ex-students and in­
terested persons are en­
couraged to attend.

Muleshoe Fine Arts will 
meet tomorrow, Monday, 
night at 7:30 p.m. in the 
band hall at Muleshoe High
School.

All parents of band, art 
and speech students are 
invited to attend.

*****
Muleshoe Youth Activi­

ties Committee will sponsor 
youth skating on Thursday, 
September 25 from 6:30 • 
9:30 p.m. at the Bailey 
County Exhibition Center 
and Coliseum.

Admission will be $1 per 
skater.

*****
On Monday, September 

29, adult sakting is sche­
duled for the Bailey County 
Exhibition Center and Coli­
seum.

Skating will be from 8-10 
p.m. and admission will be 
SI per skater.

Gary F. Lackey of Mule­
shoe was among 137 stu­
dents receiving Doctor of 
Veterinary Medicine de­
grees at Texas A&M Uni- 

• versity’s summer com­
mencement exercises.

In addition, 1.365 de­
grees were awarded in 
separate ceremonies, in­
cluding 945 undergra-

Tanksley has predicted a 
15-30 percent overall re­
duction in com production 
in the county. “ However,” 
he » id, ea a brighter note, 
“ some of the better fields 
will be average to better in 
their yields.”

This prediction was also 
fairly close to that of Cliff 
Griffith of Griffith Elevator 
and Wayne Crittenden of 
Sesame Seed, who both 
said the overall yields will 
be 20-30 percent less than 
last year.

However, seed corn that 
opened around S5.10 last 
year, was selling for S6.07 
on the open market late 
last week. Also, the price 
paid for premium white 
food corn ranged from 
S6.50 to S10, with a fairly 
stable S6.50 being paid for 
yellow food corn.

Last year, at this same 
time, white food com o- 
pened around $5.75 and 
yellow food corn was selling 
for around S5.50.

Also, according to the 
local elevator operators, 
more food com has been 
planted in the area this 
year, and the demand for 
premium food corn is high.

Muleshoe Co-op Gin said 
cotton futures late last 
week showed cotton being 
contracted for around 77-79’ 
cents per pound, up from 
the 50-55 cents offered at 
the same time last year, 
with most of the cotton sold 
for around 55 cents.

Cotton prices arc expec­
ted to remain strong this 
year, with a good demand 
for cotton fibers, according 
to early predictions.

It was estimated Friday 
that around 20 percent of 
this year’s harvest was 
completed, with harvest 
operations moving at a 
steady pace, according to 
the county agent. East of 
Bailey County, com harvest 
was more than half com­
pleted, as most producers 
opted to harvest their crops 
earlier this year.

Tanksley also said that 
the drouth has made the 
yellow corn yields low this 
year, especially on the gray 
soil south of the railroad 
tracks in the county. To the

crop yield was expected.
He explained that the 

gray soil is only 10-18 
inches deep, and is unable 
tc- maintain water storage 
early in the year and in 
drouth situations such as 
this year, the crops are 
more hard-pressed for 
water.

“ Red soil has a deeper 
profile,” he concludes, "it 
will hold more moisture in 
storage and in those areas, 
the corn did not suffer as 
severly as the crops in the 
gray soil areas.”

He also said the cotton 
crops were not more 
severely affected in the 
gray soil area, as the soil 
does not appear to have 
that much effect on the 
cotton.

Tanksley stressed that it 
is not the inability of the 
farmer to water that cut 
production, but the very 
high heat forced evapora­
tion of the water almost 
faster than it could be 
applied to the roots of the 
com. Also the county agent 
said it is not the fault of the 
soil.

As for cotton yields, the 
county agent said it would 
be after the first freeze 
before any accurate pre­
dictions can be made as to 
the potential yields.

Bollworms and beet army 
worms did heavy damage to 
the crops this year, and 
although there are a lot of 
bolls open early, no esti­
mates on production can be

City Officer 
Captures One

In Burglary
In the early morning 

hours on Wednesday, 
Muleshoe City Patrolman 
Julian Dominguez captured 
one of two suspects who 
had just burglarized the 
Muleshoe Flying Service.

The white male was ta­
ken into custody and later 
released on bond and a 
warrant was issued for the 
arrest of a second white 
male suspect in the case.

Officer Dominguez has 
been ”Johnny - on- the-

made now.
“ The High Plains was 

relatively free of other in­
sects as far as cotton is

-Con't on page 6, Col. 1

Finally, it is a dream 
come true! Early Wednes­
day afternoon, the loan was 
closed to start construction 
on the long-awaited senior 
citizen housing complex in 
Muleshoe.

Members of the Mule­
shoe Housing Authority 
Board and interested per­
sons met at the offices of 
local attorney Norman 
Bays, for closing of the 
FHA loan in the amount of 
$528,000.

Harmon Elliott, chair­
man of the Muleshoe Hou­
sing Authority, said Friday 
afternoon that construction 
is expected to start at the 
location just south of Ave­
nue K and west of West 
Seventh Street in approxi­
mately 10 days.

With a 290 day comple­
tion scheduled, the first 20 
units of the housing com­
plex are expected to be 
ready for occupancy some­
time during the first two

City Tax Rebate 
Showing Increase

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock said late last week 
that Texas cities levying the

Horns Slip 
By Sundown

Friday night, the Laz­
buddie Longhorns found 
‘the handle' and put 
together a 16-6 victory over 
the Sundown Roughnecks, 
but Lazbuddie Head Foot­
ball Coach Bob Masters 
said the ‘Horns had 
troubles along the way.

Costly mistakes and pen­
alties cost the Longhorns, 
but with a stiff wind blow­
ing, the Longhorns stayed 
on the ground, and after a 
mistake-ridden first half, 
dominated the second half 
of the game.

Blake Buchcnau struck 
for the Longhorns in the 
second half when he return­
ed a kickoff for 80 yards, 
then capped this off with a 
seven yard scramble for the 
end zone. After four tries, 
marked by penalties for 
both teams, the PAT 
attempt(s) failed.

In the fourth, the ‘Horns 
managed a safety to add 
two points, then on one of 
those razzle-dazzle plays 
which delight football fans, 
Ariel Sanchez found David 
Lust on a 22 yard pass play 
in the end zone. The Long­
horns’ Steve Monreal ran in 
two extra points to end 
scoring for the Longhorns.

“ It was a wild ball 
game," said coach Master, 
“ It was full of costly mist­
akes.”

Lazbuddie had II First 
downs, 256 yards rushing 
and 50 yards passing.

Coach Masters said Ariel 
Sanchez returned two kick­
offs for 40 yards each time; 
passed twic for 18 yards;

optional one-percent city 
sales tax would receive 
$25.5 million in rebates for 
September.

Bullock said this month’s 
city sales tax allocations 
pushes the 1980 payments 
to more than $418.5 million 
compared to $364.5 million 
paid to cities through Octo­
ber of last year.

Muleshoe’s share of the 
tax rebate was $8,249.59, 
down slightly from the 
same month last year when 
the rebate was $8,528.90. 
At the same time, the total 
to date for the year reflects 
a 10 percent increase with 
total payments to date of 
$128,207.30, compared to 
$116,117.20 at the same 
time last year.

At Morton, no increase 
has been noted between 
payments to date for this 
year when compared with 
payments through Septem­
ber last year. The total 
payments to Morton 
through September 1979 
were $36,814.70, up a few 
dollars to the $36,857.82 
reported this year. For the 
month, the rebate check for 
Morton this year was 
$1,948.07 and at the same 
time last year was 
$1,317.88.

Littlefield had a drastic 
increase for monthly pay­
ments comparing Septem­
ber this year with the same 
month last year. This year, 
the tax rebate check for the 
month of September was 
$8,770.98, compared to 
$5,250.54 at the same time 
last year. For the year to 
daie, the increase in tax 
rebates at Littlefield is only 
three percent. Receipts for 
September this year were 
$169,117.94, compared to 
the $162,836.74 for the 
same time last year.

Tax rebates for Friona 
are up eight percent for the

weeks of July 1981.
Elliott explained that a- 

long with the first 20 units 
of the originally planned 50 
units, will be a community 
room, including a meeting 
room, kitchen, office and 
laundry facilities.

The color coordinated fa­
cilities will be one and two 
bedroom units, and will be 
occupied solely by senior 
citizens who have pre­
viously signed up to occupy 
the special housing.

An innovative feature of 
the housing will be an ‘alert 
system'. It will be in both 
the bedroom and bathroom 
of the individual housing 
units, and can be reached 
even if an individual has 
fallen and cannot arise.

When activated, the alert 
system will sound a vocal 
alarm, turn on a red light 
outside the unit and auto­
matically unlock the front 
door, allowing easy rescue 
of the sick or injured occu­
pant.

All units will be fur­
nished with refrigerators 
and stoves, and will have 
outlets for washers and 
dryers. All utilities, except 
telephone, will be included 
in the monthly rental pay­
ment, and the housing will 
be tepaired and maintained 
by the Muleshoe Housing 
Authority.

Many senior citizens 
have already signed up to 
occupy the new housing, 
and it will be alloted on a 
first come-first serve basis.

Elliott also stressed that 
as the initial request for 50 
units had been cut to the 
starting 20 units, the Mule­
shoe Housing Authority 
will be re-applying for 
funds for the other 30 units 
as soon as construction 
begins on the first 20 units.

City Dads 
Set Rate 
For Taxes

Meeting in special ses­
sion Thursday morning, the 
Muleshoe City Council 
planned a public hearing 
before establishing the tax 
rate for the next year. 
However, no citizens 
showed up for the hearing, 
so the city council approved 
the tax rate.

Established for the tax 
rate was 60 cents per $100 
valuation, which will be a 
17.65 percent increase over 
the last year. For the past 
year, the tax rate was 66 
cents per $100, but proper­
ty in the city and county 
was re-valued, and proper­
ty values increased.

The city expects to have 
some $812,000 in the gen­
eral fund for the next year, 
with $292,00 of this money 
coming in from taxes. This 
will be an increase of some 
$60,000 in tax funds over 
the $231,984 in taxes col­
lected last year.

Next Tuesday, a budget

Mules Held Hornets 
Through First Half

Although the score per­
haps does not reflect it, , the 
statistics from the Friday 
night rout of the Mules at 
Tulia were close. Holding 
the hornets scoreless dur­
ing the first half of the 
game, the Muleshoe Mules 
totally dominated the half 
and made their only score 
in the 20-7 loss to the 
Hornets.

The game was played 
before an almost-capacity 
homecoming crowd at the 
Tulia football field. Follow­
ing a scoreless first quar­
ter, the Mules fully 
controlled the second quar­
ter as Mule quarterback 
Monty Hysinger put toget­
her a series of plays which 
culminated in a 22 yard 
touchdown pass to Benny 
Pena with 5:01 left in the 
half. Hysinger then kicked 
the extra point and the 
Mules went into the locker 
at halftime with 7-0 on the 
scoreboard.

After completely domin­
ating the third quarter, the 
Hornets struck. They made 
14 plays, and consumed 
over eight minutes on the 
clock before Tulia quarter­
back Wade Littlefield made 
it over from the one in a 
quarterback sneak.

In making the score, the

Mule defense had main­
tained a goalline stance, 
following a pass inter­
ference call and held the 
Hornets out of the end zone 
for three plays from the one 
yard line. Littlefield then 
made it over and the extra 
point kick was made by 
Anthony Davis.

Taking advantage of 
Mule fumbles, Tulia again 
took over the ball deep in 
Mule territory, and less 
than two minutes into the 
fourth, pulled ahead of the 
Mules when speedy Andy 
Stewart scampered for five 
yards. The PAT by Davis 
was good, the stunned 
Mule fans saw the Hornets 
ahead of the Muleshoe 
Mules.

A series of fumbles and 
pass interceptions kept 
handing the ball back to the 
Hornets, although the Mule ‘ 
defense was strong, each 
time the ball turned over, it 
would be deep in Muleshoe 
territory, giving Hornets 
excellent field position.

Mule defense held the 
Hornets out of the end zone 
until :51 seconds were left 
in the game, and Tulia 
again took advantage of a 
turnover by the Mules and 
AB Littlefield slammed 
Con’t on page 6. Col. 3

WHOSE IS IT?.....Deputy Sheriff Henderson said the 
owner of this tub may claim it by checking with him at the
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Regular 47.25
No.6ic66 
HR78-14  
R E G .  49.35 
No. 61C45  
GA78-15  
R E G .  48.85 
No. 61C49  
HR78-1S  
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No. 61C64  
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Polyester And Class Construction 
Jr with an aggressive tread design.

Great Radial Tire Performance 
And Good Looks.

3 CONVENIENT LOCATIONS
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Also Muleshoe Texas

Open Letter 
To

The Public

THIS IS A PUBLIC ROAD??.....This dump, which is not supposed to be a dump, is located 
two miles south and one and six-tenths miles west of Muleshoe along a county dirt road. 
Many telephone calls have been coming in from individuals who travel the road. They say 
that in many instances, drivers have to stop and remove discarded junk from the roadway to 
open the road. Although at least two persons said they have contacted the Bailey County 
Commissioner's Court about the debris, nothing has been done to clean it up. According to 
the county map, the location is in Precinct Two as it was re-districted a few years ago.

Sew It With Cotton Contest
The theme for the Sew- 

It-With-Cotton contest was 
“ Cotton Booms into a Gar­
den of Fashion” . It was 
presented by the Bailey 
County Cotton Club Tues­
day, September 16 in the 
Three Way School Auditor­
ium.

Winners in the 11 cate­
gories included; Lollipop 
and Little Esquire, Holly 
Hutton and Kyle Kindle; 
Guys and Dolls, Melinda 
Turney and Shclli Terrell; 
At Home Wear, Mary Kin­
dle, Sammie Simpson and 
Paula Foley; Halloween 
Costumes, Kyle and Bryan 
Kindle; Playtime, Shane 
Terrell, Brittany Kirby and 
Holly Jutton; School Time, 
Carrie Ann Kindle and 
Melinda Turney; Sleepy 
Time, Keith Kindle, Hea­
ther Hutton and Staci Kin­
dle; Junior Miss, Shelly 
Sain, Lori Carlisle and 
Shelli Terrell; Sports Time, 
Ann Sowder, Pryncess 
Parkman and Staci Kindle; 
Teen Time, Julie Carlisle, 
De’Ann Foley and Belinda 
Wheeler; Fashion Time, 
Doyleen Terrell, Druscilla 
Hutton and Kelly Foley.

Narrators for the event 
were Mary Furgeson and 
Saundra Pool. Olene Mc­
Cann of Levelland, Kay 
Houston of Morton and 
Wynon Myers of Plainview 
judged the ensembles.

All entries were made of 
100 percent cotton, en­
trants in Junior Miss and 
Team Time made their 
garments. First place win­
ners will compete in a 
District Contest in Lubbock

^ u u j / a & u }^  M**o«rA»« trOW

IMIMilIX
of the
MONTH
now

I  Bant. 
* not incl

MR. SHARPY
PENCIL
s h a r p e n e r
'..ordleM sharpens turns 
on autom atically  whan  
pane# i*  inserted Snap- 
off receptacle stops oper­
ation for safety. 37-11 
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401 S. 1st.
Muleshoe
272-4511

at the Civic Center Satur­
day, September 27.

Sponsors for the event 
included Maple Co-op Gin; 
Tide Products, Inc.; Lit­
tlefield; Muleshoe Co-op 
Gin; Morton Delinting, 
Inc.; Needmore Co-op Gin; 
Maple Grocery; Farmers 
Co-op Gin, Littlefield; Sun­
belt Delinting, Littlefield; 
Dent Rempe, Wooley 
Hurst, Star Route Gin, 
Morton; Sanders Fertilizer, 
Morton; Allis Chalmers, 
Muleshoe; Baker Farm

Supply; A.V.I.; Farmers 
Co-op Gin, Enochs; Farm 
Equipment co., Morton; 
Roy Whitt Chevrolet; Luper 
Tire, Morton; Cox Auto 
Supply, Morton; Case 
Power and Equipment, Lit­
tlefield; Lewis Farm and 
Ranch, Morton; First State 
Bank, Morton; Nickels Gin, 
Littlefield; Fry and Cox; 
Byble Equipment, Morton; 
Armes Equipment, Little­
field; and American Cotton 
Growere, Littlefield.

Several of you asked me 
to describe the duties of a 
County Commissioner. In­
dividually, a County Com­
missioner serves as an ad­
ministrator of County road 
and bridge construction 
and maintenance depart­
ments within his Precinct 
unless this responsibility 
has been given to a road 
administrator or engineer.

For many years, many 
County Commissioners 
throughout the state have 
survived elections because 
they devoted a majority of 
their time to this very 
visible portion of their du­
ties. This caused them to 
more or less neglect their 
collective duties when 
functioning within the focal 
point of County Govern­
ment, the Commissioner’s 
Court. By statute, the 
Commissioner’s Court is 
responsible for transporta­
tion and transportation fa­
cilities; care of the dis­
advantaged; elections and 
political boundaries; agri­
culture and conservation; 
public health, safety and 
sanitation; education and 
recreation; County facilities 
such as the court house, jail 
and other governmental of­
fices. The Commissioner’s 
Court is also responsible for 
functions that are not as­
signed to a special County 
official.

Today, a County Com­
missioner can no longer

approach these other duties 
with such a casual attitude. 
When a County Commis­
sioner sits in the Com­
missioner’s Court, his 
function, by statute, makes 
him responsible to the 
whole County, not just his 
Precinct. Along with his 
individual duty to provide 
good roads, he must dis­
charge all his duties with 
equal diligence and vigor. 
The good old days are gone 
forever. Times have caught 
up with us. The people will 
no longer tolerate ineffi­
cient operation.

1 have twenty years of 
management experience 
that is equivalent to County 
level and higher. If you 
want to take advantage of 
the service and experience I 
am offering, invest a little 
of your time and vote for 
me in November. I’ll give 
you a good return on your 
investment.

Respectfully,
Thomas S. Freeman 

Republican Candidate
County Commissioner 

Precinct 1
Pd. pol. adv. by Thomas S. 
Freeman

I N T S  F O R

OME OWNERS!

P o w e r f u l  Id e a s
You don’t have to break 

your back getting ready for 
that backyard garden.

Tilling the soil, can be a 
breeze, if you use modern 
power equipment and till 
according to safety sugges­
tions from the Outdoor 
Power Equipment Institute:

1. Before using the ma­
chine, read the owner’s 
manual. Know how controls 
and attachments work.

rSSy b a n k

THOMAS S. FREEMAN

24 hour 
bank

SHOE!
BANK

M i l
l lA

101 A M E R IC A N  B LV D  •  272-4561 •  M em ber F D IC

History Of A Spudnut
Spudnuts arc more than Doughnuts. They are the lightest, fluffiest, best tasting pastries 

in the world. They are “ the upper crust of the donut world” .
Spudnuts are different from ordinary doughnuts because of their special ingredients and 

quality controlled production Only the very finest materials are used to create the unique 
Spudnut flavor and texture. High quality, specially blended flour, pure vegetable 
shortening, rich spices selected from the world's best, and choice potatoes are scientifically 
mixed and blended in Spudnuts automated mixing plant.

The emphasis on quality began with Spudnuts in 1939, when Al and Bob Pelton 
discovered their potatoe doughnut recipe. After countless hours of peciing, boiling and 
mashing thousands of pounds of potatoes and blending numerous varieties of flours and 
spices, they finally found the right blend of ingredients. It was the ideal mixture for a 
consistently light, fluffy, tender potatoe doughnut with a unique and delicate flavor. They 
dubbed their new product "Spudnuts" after the slang word for potatoe—-Spud.

Visit Our Newly Remodeled Shop 
& Take Home Some Spudnuts Today!

We have ninny varieties to choose from!

Take Advantage Of Our 
Delicious Short Orders For Lunch

Hamburgers Bar-B Que Sandwiches
Chicken Strips Steak Fingers

Fresh Food Daily
Open 5 a.m. - 2 p.m.

Closed Sunday

Owned By:
Cleo & Beth Webb

West Plains 
Medical Center 

Report

Muleshoe 
Singing Group 

Meets

ADMITTED
September 15, Alfred Flo­
res
September 16, Blanca Ja- 
quez, Ramon Baca, Virgi­
nia Pone, Mary McDer- 
man, Ruby Murdock. Au­
rora Tuentona 
September 17, Don Ric­
hards, Randy Ball, Junita 
Sanchez, Ed Steinbeck, 
Rosa Sneed, (same! Cas­
anova, Joe Casterena 
September 18, Kathy Es­
pinoza

The Muleshoe Singing 
Group met in the 
Fellowship Hall of the 
Trinity Baptist Church, 
Saturday at 7:30 p.m. 
Invocation was given by 
O.W. Marlow. J. C. Shanks 
presided over the meeting.

The first hymn was a 
musical with Ralph Miller

on the h»cc "••itar 
C. Shanks at the pia 
Cecil Rundell on 
harmonica. The cor 

tion began singing wi 
musicians.

Thirty three 
present, with Mr. ancu 
Wesley Barnes from] 
buddie, Mrs. Winnie j 
from Farwell. Mr. and 
Harvey Toten of Mult 
Lee Pool and Rc 
Pool also of Muleshc 

Lee Pool gave] 
benediction.

DISMISSED
Sept. 15, Teresa Garcia, 
Mafia Franco, Robbie 
Damron, Ray Bevers 
Sept. 16, Jim Castlebarry, 
Yalanda Bora and baby 
girl, Ron Patton 
Sept. 17, Gene McGuire, 
Aurora Tuentona 
Sept. 18. Lea Cumpain, 
Sylvia Jaquez and baby boy

Coming Soon
The

Vial Of Life
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Toast, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH

Frito Pie 
Pinto Beans 
Green Salad 
Fruit
Cornbread 

September 22-26 Milk

Lazbuddie 
School Menu

MONDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Oats, Raisins, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH

Turkey &.Egg Noodles
Cranberry Sauce
Green Beans
Hot Rolls
Fruit
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Dry Cerell, Juice. Milk 
LUNCH

Salisbury Steak&Gravy
Cream Potatoes
Mixed Vegetables
Pudding
Hot Rolls
Milk

TUESDAY
'A BREAKFAST

THURSDAY
BREAKFAST

Rice, Raisins, Milk 
LUNCH

Pork Loaf 
Blackeyed Peas 
Fried Okra 
Cornbread 

^  Fruit 
Milk

FRIDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Do-nuts, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH

Hamburger or Sloppy Joe
French Fries
lettuce, Onions, Pickles
Fruit Geletin
Milk

*  *  *  •

Too many individuals 
try to be smart instead of 
truthful

A ‘Pick-Me-Up’
“ Where’s Dad?” 
"Somebody made him a 

present of a small bottle of 
brandy so he’s gone into the 
bedroom to feel faint!”

A campaign for change in 
Dominican Republic.

Mrs. Gandhi:lndia falling 
to “anarchy & indiscipline” .

12 Volt DC  Fuel
Transfer Pump

Delivers lip To 13 Gallons Per Minute

Muleshoe Electric
210 E . 3rd Muleshoe 272-4571

Carelessness is a great Disappointments are
killer in the home and on* inevitable if you have 
the highway. ambition or hope.

withdraw cash

. . .  the 
24 hour 

bank

i  Ml I.KSHOF.fi 
STATE BANK

101 A M E R IC A N  B L V D  •  272-4561  •  M e m b er F D IC
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That Is why therefcW ell keep you 
looking good for less

Boys’ and Girls’ Coats
Great coats and great savings! We've got a fantastic 
assortment of kids’ coats and jackets on sale now 
lots of styles and colors m at children's sues. Keep them 
warm and get super value!

Velour
Shirts

Velour is a fan fashion clas 
sic! We've got a special group 
of men’s velour shirts on sale 
now —  choose from many hand 
some styles m favonte colors. 
Sizes S,M,L,XL.

J u n io r

ATB Ski Jacket
i Junior JeansOn or off the si 

These polyester

Be a hit n  ATB! They're 100% cotton 
i denim jeans with scene stealing 
i  pocket designs. Choose from  
v  straight or fere legs, sizes 3-15.

Bestform
BRA'S

Giant Selection

Special Group

2 FOR $5
•  Strapless and 

Regular

ft  Values to 5.
•  Large Group
•  Fall Colors

Sew And Save With Our
FALL FASHION FABRICS FESTIVAL

48 Inch

100% COTTON DENIM

First quality, Blue Indigo Denim. 
Perfect for jeans, skirts, and 
separates. Rolled on tubes.

Short Lengths
FALL FASHION FABRICS

•54-60" SUEDE KNIT 
•4 5 "  corduroy 
•YOUR CHOICE

60" Stretch 
Gabardine

Sew and save for Fa* with our 6 0 "  stretch 
gabardme! It ’s 100%  Kodef" polyester it 
makes beautiful, easy care skrts, slacks and 
jackets. Choose from a variety of nch Fall 
colors.

2.99 yd

2 yds. FOR $5
"New Shipment Arrived"

60'
Great

Gauze Knit
It’s p eat gauze at a great pnce1 These 
6 0 "  gauze knrts are 100%  American 
Enka* polyester. They're great for 
dresses and blouses n  lustrous fa l 
pruts.

"New Shipment"
60" Washable Woolens i
Beautiful fall fashion is sew easy with our 6 0 " wash­
able woolens! Made of 80%  acrylic and 20%  wool, 
they’re perfect for tailored styles. In assorted soWs , 
and coordinating plaids.

9-9 yd.

L yds. for
"New Shipment"

60" Suede
For elegant fashwn, our 6 0 "  suede is perfect! 
Made of 100%  polyester, it sews into beautiful 
dresses and separates. Choose from nch Fall 
shades. Coordnatng prints are 3.99 yd.

$5 9-9yd.

2  yds. for ^ 1 0
Luxurious

60" STRETCH VELOUR
Elegant tops and activewear can be



ISe if? Styles 

Men & Boys

Western Suits

IACK fORTT

Men & Women
Leather Coats

uyaway

I ran certainly understand hi* being nervi»u».
fimt operation loo.'

ic ■/. ’i< ‘ir^u  v i^ u ^ u n iF ^ re y r^ Jk-̂ u  v ,
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Mrs. Vic Benedict served 
orange Sherbut punch and 
cookies from crystal ap­
pointments.

Special guests were the 
bride's mother, Mrs. Ber- 
nis Camp and Mrs. Ernest 
Brock, mother of the 
groom.

The hostesses gave indi­
vidual gifts. Hostesses for 
the occasion were Mrs. 
Clarence Wilhite, Mrs. Vic 
Benedict, Mrs. Lena Haw­
kins, Mrs. Kenneth Pre- 
cure and Miss Linda Davis.

4-H Club 
First Meeting
Of Year

The Muleshoe 4-H Club 
had their first meetin for 
the 1980-81 year at the 16th 
and Ave. d Church of 
Christ, Monday, Septem­
ber 15.

Bar-B-Que sandwiches 
and all the trimmings were 
served to 24 members and 
19 parents and guests.

Ronnie Logsdon led the 
group in the 4-H motto and 
pledge. Holly Huckaby led 
the pledge of alligiance.

Zanna Huckaby reported 
on the skating party the 
club sponsored. Mandy 
Plank reported on the Dis­
trict Dress Review.

The leader, Linda Huck­
aby, introduced a point 
system the club would work 
in this year with a trip to 
Brownwood 4-H Camp, be­
ing awarded to the high 
point winner.

Installation of officers 
was the program. Those 
installed were; Marlin By­
num. president; Michelle 
Logsdon, vice president; 
Chantel Robinson, secre­
tary; Ronnie Logsdon, 
treasurer; Zanna Huckaby, 
reporter; Mandy Plank and 
Tim Sain, co-council dele­
gates; Shelly Sain, game 
leader.

Year pins were awarded 
to Tim and Shelly Sain, 
seven years; Nette, Ther­
esa. Thurman and Willie 
Coleman, five years; Man­
dy Plank, four years; Zanna 
Huckaby, Michelle Logs­
don and Ronnie Logsdon, 
three years; Chantel Rob­
inson and Marlin Bynum, 
two years; and Lisa Hamil­
ton, one year.

New member pins were 
given to Crystal Angely, 
Carol. Renee and Lee Cop­
ley and Troy Watson.

Pee Wee's recognized 
were Holly Huckaby, two 
years; Pam Plank and Lisa 
Coleman, four years; Colin 
Robinson. Dana Hamilton 
and Neil Watson, new 
members.

The 4-H members signed 
up for coming projects. 
Linda Huckaby, leader, was 
presented with a gift from 
the members. Marlin By­
num adjourned the 
meeting.

lMas xKip ^B/tock c&ono/ted QAiitti Qliowe/t
Mrs. Kip Brock was hon­

ored with a bridal shower at 
8 p.m. Thursday, Septem­
ber 18 in the parlor of the 
First Baptist Church.

The serving table was 
covered with a white lace 
cloth and accented with a 
floral arrangement of yel­
low' mums and assorted 
flowers.

Library
hem

MRS. KIP BROCK

Brownie Troop 247 
Holds Firt First Meeting

The first meeting of the 
Brownies was held Wed­
nesday, September 17, in 
the Girl Scout Hut, located 
at 817 W. 2nd. There were 
22 Brownies present.

The leaders, Margaret 
Copley and Jerehtta Rogers 
led the girls in a devotional, 
followed by the Pledge of 
Alligience. Flag bearers 
were Lisa Coleman, Audrey 
Williams, Shelly Gable, 
Brandi Estep, Chanda 
Kemp and Erin Kelly. The 
Brownies were then shown 
how to fold a flag.

Brownie dues were col­
lected and the leaders dis­
cussed the future activities 
with the Brownies.

The importance of reci­
ting and obeying the Brow­
nie Law and the Brownie 
Promise were discussed 
with the girls.

Refreshments were 
served to all the girls 
present. Those present 
were Lisa Coleman, Shelly 
Gable, Chanda Kemp, 
Kristina Stewart, LaTavia 
Copley, Lilly Garza, Lucy 
Anguiano, Audrey Wil­
liams, She Wilbanks, Tina 
Copley, Sissy Morris and 
Gloria Guillen.

Anyone interested in be­
coming a Brownie or Brow­
nie Leader may contact 
Margaret Copley at 
272-3697.

The Muleshoe Area 
Public Library has on dis­
play a collection of bells 
belonging to Anita 
Lobough.

She has bells from 
foriegn countries such as 
England, the Netherlands, 
Jeruselum and from many 
states. Ann Camp said 
“ Wc are happy to have 
such an interesting collec­
tion” .

The Library has as artist 
of the month, Gladys Arm­
strong from Farwell. "Mrs. 
Armstrong has some very- 
fine work on display,” said 
Mrs. Camp.

Twenty seven were in 
attendance at story hour 
Wednesday morning, with 
the Muleshoe Young 
Homemakers helping. Two 
Walt Disney films were 
shown. “ Lambert, The 
Sheepish Lion" and a fairy 
tale, "Tom Thumb” . Judy 
Davenport did "The Little 
Red Shoes” .

The next story hour will 
be the first Wednesday in 
October, with members of 
Epsilon Delta Chapter of 
E.S.A. helping and all pre­
school age children , three 
or over are invited.

MR. AND MRS. JAMES SHEER

Muleshoe welcomes Colleen and James Sheer this week. 
Sheer comes to Muleshoe from Wellington. James attended 
Clarendon Junior College. Sheer is now associated with the 
Soil Conservation office here in Muleshoe. As hobbies, 
Colleen enjoys reading and James enjoys camping and 
music. The Sheers’ are Baptist and reside at 509 W. Ave. B.

James Crane Tire Co.
GOODpYEAR

322 N. 1st. 272-4594
In  1893 wine was so plen­
tifu l and water so scarce 
that coachmen were seen 
w a s h in g  d o w n  carriages 
w i t h  s t i l l  c h a m p a g n e .  

•  *  *  *

■ Damron Rexalt 
Drug

Henry Insurance 
Agency

Box 563 Muleahoe
Courtesy is so cheap 

that most people take no 
interest in it.

308 Main
rzzl feJr=Jr=Jr=J7^

272-4210

Children s
Home
Associates

1 he Muleshoe Associates 
of the Portales Christian 
Children's Home met 
Monday, eptember8, at the 
home of hazel Waddell to 
make eight fake fur bear 
plaques and several frigies 
to sell for the benefit of the 
home.

There were eight present 
besides the hostess. Marie 
Collum, Jessie Sherwood, 
Ruth Williams, Oneida 
Cornelison, Bernice Amer- 
son. Modin Elmore, Florine 
Mills and Mabel Caldwell.

Many of the articles were 
sold locally, but a number 
are taken to the annual sale 
at Portales, which will be 
Saturday. October 8.

WOTS
Weekly Meeting

Mrs. Caldwell siad any­
one interested, is urged to 
attend because there will 
be a lot of hand made 
articles from other clubs.

The hostess served re­
freshments of Italian cream 
cake, coffee, and sherbut 
punch. The club meets 
twice monthly, the first and 
third Mondays. They would 
be happy to have anyone 
interested come and help 
them work.

* * * *
Children would be 

more religious if their 
parents practiced religion 
more in everyday life.

* * * * '

S incere , sen s itiv e , 
idealists would do well to 
stav out of nolitics.

A lot of sewing circles 
are not concerned with 
sewing.

101 A M E R IC A N  B L V D . •  2 7 2 -4 5 6 1  •  M e m b e r F D IC
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W.O.T.S. met Thursday. 
September 18 at Harvey 
Bass Appliance. Sandie 
Smith and Larry Landusky. 
both of Lubbock gave a 
Jenn Air demonstration. 
Mildred Williams and Lois 
Martinec were the hostes­
ses.

Members present were 
Deborah Sir, Debbie Coo­
per and Chad. Rhonda Car­
ney, Cory and Candy, all of 
Littlefield; Anita Taylor of 
Earth, and Ramona En- 
gram of Sudan.

Also Jackie Self, Doris 
Fightmaster. Helen Wil­
liams, Lois Martinec, Zell- 
ma Toler, Desie Toler and 
Phillip, Mary Williams. 
Mildred Williams and Betty 
Barker, all of Muleshoe.

Guests presnet were Kay 
Stringfield of Littlefield. 
Mrs. Carl Pollard. Blanche 
Lendcrson. Janie Mosley, 
Harvey and Marie Bass, all 
of Muleshoe. Sandie Smith 
and Larry Landusky both of 
Lubbock.

Next week W.O.T.S. will 
meet at 11:30 a.nt. in the 
Tri-County Community 
Room with Betty Barker 
and Ramona Engram as 
hostesses.

Herb Miller
The New 

Manager
° f

A&MFarm
Store.

\ Herb is from 
5 Clovis, N.M. where 
\ he was associated with Taylor Evans 
2 Seed as a Sales Coordinator. Miller is 
\ experienced in all phases of agricutlture \ 
\ related products.

Come in, have a cup o f coffee, & get acquainted!

Herb Miller

L
A&MFARM & RANCH SUPPLY

AXVVVVCVXV\XV\\\WtVC\VV\X\\\\\\\V\\\\V\Vi\\\vx\VW\V\\V\\V\W\iK

1 My giant schnauzer 
was in better shape 
than I w as/ says 

SharonThompson.
Sharon I hompson was doggone discouraged 

about her tigure: 135 pourids and size 12 pushing 
toward a size 14 were just too much for her small 
trame. She was even getting less pleasure from the 
family hobby—breeding and showing giant schnau- 
zers. As she put it, “Who wants to run around a dog 
show nng with a dog in better shape than its han­
dler?”

Both Ms. Thompson and her mother solved their 
weight problems at Pat Walker’s. “Now I am 25 
pounds and 32 inches slimmer, getting ready for the 
next show circuit in size 5 clothes!” Her mother, she 
reports, has had equally good results.

Tou also can attain the slender tigure you’ve always 
wanted on our proven program of weight reduction— 
without rigid diets or exhausting exercises. Moreover, 
you can reduce privately and in a dignified manner in 
our comfortable, luxurious salon.

Come see for yourself how pleasantly you can lose 
unwanted pounds at Pat Walker’s; we’ll be delighted 
to give you a complimentary treatment and figure 
analysis. There's no obligation. Just call in advance 
to reserve time for your free appointment.

Over 27 i/i'iirs of success 
in weight reiluction

sum

sab’”"
,,nu' tie*"1'

119 Ave. C 
Muleshoe PH. 272-4591

*'hiirtm 1 Kom|isnn 
HMOKI beginning 

treatments

8 to 8
Mon. thru Fri.

9 to  12 
Sot.
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Si&e/t b ed d in g  

ufonweteortg C eQebitated
In celebration of their 

silver wedding anniversary, 
Barbara and Max Crim 
were honored Sunday af­
ternoon, August 24 at a 
reception in their home.

The joyous occasion was 
hosted by the couple’s 
family, their daughter and 
granddaughter. Cindy and 
Brandy, Mrs. Crim’s moth­
er. Mrs. Arther Ritchey and 
their sisters, Johnnie Mon­
roe, Irene Ritchey and Dee 
Ann Boumann.

The serving table was 
laid with an antique ivory 
lace table cloth presented 
by Max to his parents on 
their 25th wedding anni­
versary, over a blue cloth 
and centered with a blue 
and white daisy floral ar­
rangement.

Three tiered white heart 
shaped wedding cake was 
decorated with blue roses 
and silver bells, topped 
with the bride and groom 
used on the couple’s wed­
ding cake. Punch and cof­
fee were served from a 
crystal punch bowl and 
silver and crystal carafe. 
Nuts and mints were also 
served.

Mrs. Arthur Ritchey, 
mother of the honore's 
registered the guests. 
Johnnie Monroe served the 
cake. Dee Ann Baumann 
served the punch and Irene 
Ritchie presided at the 
coffee service.

Max and Barbara were 
married August 21, 1955 in 
the home of Barbara's par­
ents. Mrs. Arthur Ritchey 
and the late Arthur Ritchey 
at Dalhart.

Latest

Arrivals

Adan Jaquez

Mr. and Mrs. Taurino 
Jaquez of Bovina are the 
proud parents of a new son 
born September 16 at 8:25 
a m. in the West Plains 
Medical Center. The young 
man weighed 8 lbs. and 11 
ozs. and has been named 
Adam. He is the first child 
for the couple.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Salvador Casta­
neda and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lebrado Jaquez, all of 
Mexico.

Most of their married life 
has been spent on the Crim 
farm in the Lazbuddie 
Community.

Progressive 
Home Club

The Progressive Home 
Club met September 17 in 
the home of Norene Thom­
as, with five members and 
a guest, Mozelle Ripoie, 
present.

Norene Thomas, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order. Roll call was an­
swered with household 
hints, also a poem entitled 
‘Happy Days” was read by 

Vera Engelking. A treasur­
er’s report was given and 
the club voted to make a 
donation to the Girl Scouts.

A flower fan wall plaque, 
made by Oma Stratton, was 
on display. Winona Gibson 
drew the hostess gift. After 
a fellowship the club was 
adjourned.

Refreshments of lemon 
chiffon pie, chips, dips, 
coffee and Dr. Pepper were 
served by the hostess to 
Mozelle Ripoie. Lucille 
Harper. Pat Johnson, Wi­
nona Gibson and Vera En­
gelking. * * * •

A bullet may be dead­
ly, but rapid-fire tongues 
often claim many victims.

agri-
facts
By

B ill W ooley

Corn growers concern for 
greater energy efficiency is
being rapidly reflected in 
crop trends all over the 
country. Corn crops are 
being planted earlier and 
developers are working to 
get out varieties with suf­
ficient cold tolerance to 
begin growing in 40 degree 
soil. Greater numbers of 
plants are being grown in 
the same area to make 
maximum use of all 
sunlight. Research is 
moving as quickly as 
possible into more efficient 
drying systems to cut 
energy use after harvest. 
Some of the best results 
using simplified solar 
collectors are being reported 
this season. Energy ef­
ficiency has auickly become 
one of the Keys to even 
greater farm productivity, 
and will continue to 
challenge producers in the 
future.

Wooley -Hurst Inc. 
W.Hwy.84 
Muleshoe

Young Homemakers Week
September 22-27,1980

Muleshoe Young Homemakers Provide Community Service

Mrs. Harbin, Sponsor & Neu Mem bers

Cashway Grocery
Dot’s Shop 

Muleshoe State Bank
Story hour At Public Library

McCormick Seeds Inc.
First National Bank 

Decorators Nursery & Floral
Main Street Beauty Shop 

Production Credit Association 
Farmers Co-op Elevators

Something Special

Babysitting Services For School Activities

Microwave Oven For High School Home Ec. Dept.

Shipm an & Sons Body Shop

Spudnut Shop

Muleshoe Co-op Gins
The Honey Com b

Williams Bros. Office Supply

John Custom Mills 
West Plains Pharmacy

Playground Equipment ForlSew City Park

Albertson s Shop for Men 

Western Drug Co. 

Dinner Bell Cafe 

Muleshoe Publishing Co.

Bailey County Electric Cooperative Association
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Crop ...
C'ont. from Page 1

concerned,” he commen­
ted. “ but we have seen the 
bollworms continue to build 
and the infestations have 
caused a loss to the 
farmers.”

Tanksley also said there 
was an increase to farmers 
in spraying expense be­
cause of the worm infesta­
tions in their cotton. How­
ever, he stressed that the 
spraying expense this year 
is not a normal farming 
expense, and says the 
weather was extremely fa-

Rebate •••
Cont. from Page 1
compared to the $54,768.23 
at the same time last year. 
Monthly rebates for Friona 
show $1,590.96 in Septem­
ber of this year compared to 
$3,489.03 at the same time 
last year.

Dallas will receive $2.9 
million this month, bring­
ing 1980's payments to date 
14 percent over the 1979
figures.

Houston’s check will be 
$5.1 million, boosting 1980 
payments to date to more 
than $87.4 million.

San Antonio will receive 
$1.4 million, bringing that 
city’s tax rebates this year 
to $23.3 million.

Fort Worth’s check this 
month totals $891,087.

vorable for cotton, but only 
the worms hurt the yields.

The county agent added 
that the Bula Community 
has had a lot more rain, 
from three to six inches 
more, than the rest of the 
county, but he also said 
that it was too late for this 
year’s crop. It did help, he 
continued, to be beneficial 
to late planted winter wheat 
and to help add back some 
of the depleted sub-soil 
moisture.

” We still have extremely 
dry range conditions," ad­
ded Tanksley. "Right now, 
ranchers are looking at 
supplemental pasture or 
feed for their livestock this 
winter."

"As a whole," he con­
cluded, "the summer 
drouth and extreme tem­
peratures have hurt our 
county. Because of this, the 
economics of the county, 
which relates to agriculture 
will be hurt, from the farm 
family to the businessman 
to the private individual. 
We do not expect any 
depression, but we will be 
at a virtual standstill until 
another good crop year. 
Prices are strong this year, 
but we just don’t have the 
production.”

Hard To Find 
Men, like tacks, are 

useful if they have good 
heads and are pointed in 
the right direction.

-News, Adair.

GRAVE IN THE SANDHILLS..... In the sandhills, south­
west of Muleshoe, this grave is a silent reminder of 
someone’s love for their pet. When officers dug up the 
grave nestled at the base of a sand dune, it contained the 
carcass of a dog. The grave was replaced, complete with the 
rocks to protect it from predators, the wooden cross and 
plastic flowers.

Mules,,,
Cont. from Page 1
over from two yards out to 
make it a 20-7 ball game. 
The final PAT attempt by 
Davis was blocked and the 
scoring ended at 20-7.

OB Littlefield is a highly 
touted passing QB. and he 
dominated the passing stat­
istics Friday night. He
completed seven of 13
attempts for 77 yards, while 
Muleshoe QB Monty Hy- 
singer only completed one 
pass.

The Mules had a slight 
edge on the ground with 
170 rushing yards to 102 for 
Tulia. Both Charles Walk­
er, with 83 yards; and Felix 
Norman, with 37 yards, 
were well-contained by
Hornet defense.

Muleshoe had 13 first 
downs to 15 for Tulia. In the 
first half of the game, 
Muleshoe had 10 first 
downs and Tulia had three.

F.ach team punted two 
times and Muleshoe had 16 
yards in penalties to 20 for 
the Hornets.

Muleshoe lost the ball 
two times on fumbles and 
two times on interceptions, 
and the Hornets only lost 
the ball one time on a 
fumble.

Statewide, the number of 
cattle and calves totaled 

'15.000.000 head, a 7 percent 
increase over 1979 Beet cows 
stood at 6.0X5.000 head, up 11 
percent and milk cows totaled 
315.000 head. 2 percent over 
last year.

Total feeder placements 
numbered 5.5II.OOO head, 
also a 7 percent increase over 
1979. Brown noted.

Hot'N ' Cold Cups

M C - P . ,  C 7 < t
Reg 88* V #

Large Group
Talon Zippers
Assorted Colors Viprice

Lisa Mornay 
Products .

Shampoo Bath Oil |  O  /

Conditioner Mile Bath ■

V i Gal. She Reg. *1.79

Polyester Fiberfill

Bed Pillows . . . J , x

M at Resistant , 
Non-Alergenic
Reg. *3.99 * *  #

5 R® ? {

Mens White g f*"'
Work Socks $ A 4 7
Cotton-Nylon Biend 
One Size Fits All
4 Pair Pockage %  / '

50%  Acrylic - 50%  Poly
Blankets

7 2 ", 90" $ J | 7  
Machine Wash *
Reg. ‘ 5.88 *

7

The
Sandhills

Philosopher
Editor's note: The Sand­
hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek apparently 
has had a bad dream, his 
letter this week indicates.

- O -
Dear editor:

Over the years, I’ve 
found that most people’s 
dreams are interesting 
mostly to themselves. None 
the less, I’m going to tell 
you about one 1 had.

I dreamed 1 was in 
charge of the Presidential 
debates. My job was to ask 
the candidates questions. I 
took my stand at the po­
dium and cleared my 
throat.

"Mr. President," 1 be­
gan, "what would you do to 
end inflation?”

"Doggone if I know," he 
said.

“ Govenor Reagan, what 
would you do to end in­
flation?"

"Darned if I know."
"Congressman Ander­

son, what would you do to 
end inflation?”

"Ditto.”
I declared the debates a 

draw and woke up rather 
gladly.

Back to reality, I’ve 
heard several people com­
plain that television, radio 
and newspapers con­
centrate on the bad news. 
One man I read about 
decided to do something 
about this. He began taping 
two minutes worth of good 
news every day and offer­
ing it for sale to radio 
stations. Some stations 
tried it but it proved so 
un-'istened-to they discon­
tinued it and the man went 
broke.

This bears out my theory 
that a fist fight in the 
stands always out-draws a 
play down on the football 
field.

Newspapers, TV and ra­
dio will stop reporting 
wrecks when they find peo­
ple rushing out to the 
highway because they 
heard two cars had passed 
without hitting each other.

Yours faithfully.
_ l_N

JAPAN t  CAR OUTPUT
TOKYO -- The Japanese 

automotive industry an­
nounced that Japan had 
overtaken the United States 
as the largest producer of 
cars in the world. Industry 
officials said that statistics 
for the first six months of 
1980 showed that Japan 
produced 5.5 million vehi- 
cles- better than one million 
vehicles more than the ailing 
American automotive in­
dustry.

LOPPING 
SHEARS
Blade & hook o f high- 
carbon, Teflon S* coated 
steel. Non-slip serrations 
on hook. Tubular-steel 
handles w ith  m olded  
grips. 27 in. long. 2007

401 S. 1st. 
Muleshoe 
272-4511

O N  IN T E R N A T IO N A L  T R A C T O R S

Extended to September 30. . .  
buy now  and save!
There's never been a better tim e to Go Red 
Power than right now. That's because you 
can get a great deal on a new International 
2 +2 tractor, plus a $1000 rebate. That s right. 
Buy any new International 2 -̂2 tractor and 
agree to take delivery on or before S ep­
tember 3 0 ,1980-International Harvester will 
send you a check for $1000.
The International 2+ 2 , offering tw o  wheel 
performance plus tw o wheels more drive, is 
designed to handle row  crops, specialty  
crops, small grain, dairy or feeding Opera­
tions... the 2 + 2  does it all! Choose from two  
rugged models, too: the 130 PTO hp Interna­
tional 3388, or the 150 PTO hp International 
3588.
Get a $1000 Red Power Rebate when you buy 
the International 2 +2  you need. See us today. 
For a great deal, a great tractor—and a great 
rebate from International Harvester.
Ask us about IH  C red it Power, th e  W aiver o f Finance  
pro g ram  th a t le ts  you buy n o w  and d e la y  finance  
charges until later.

Ill

I

INTERNATIONAL
AGRICULTURAL
EQUIPMENT

Wooley-Hurst Inc.
W.Hwy84 272-5514

Dog Food
fo ld  T rill 50 b. Bog

N
Prices Effective 

Sept. 21-24

DISCOUNT CENTERS
Store Hours: 
Mon-Sot. 9-7

Sun. 1*8

Shave Cream
Giotto Foamy 
llo z .R e g .*P

38$ 1

Toss Pillows

14 in. Asst. 
Colors 1  Designs

2/$5

Federal Lightning 

Ammo.
22 long Rifle

99*
16 ox.

Liquid Toilet 
Bowl Cleaner

57
12 ox. 

Spray Disinfectant

$1
R e g . ^

77

Toni
Lightwave K it 

O N I STIP SOFT PERM

Reg. *4”
$05

Summers Eve
Twin Pack R e g .*p

______ 99*
EVERY DAY LOW PRICES

Gal. Homo Milk..... *2”
Vi Gal. Homo Milk *11s

Gol. Lowfat Milk.... * l»
Vi Gal. Lowfat Milk ’l 03 
Vi Gal. Buttermilk . f i 03 
2 lb. Cottage Cheese*!93
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NOTICE
School will be dismissed 

at 2:15 Monday, September 
22 for those wishing to 
attend the South Plains Fair 
in Lubbock. Bus Schedule 
will be to leave the high 
school at 2:15.

J.V. Romps 
Over
Springlake

The JV romped over the 
Springlake-Earth 20-0 last 
Thursday.

Mike Pecina scored on a 
2 yard run in the first 
quarter. The extra point by 
Johnny Ybarra failed. The 
Wolverines fumbled on 
their second play of the 
possesion. A few plays 
later. Zeke Contreas 
scored on a trap. Ybarra 
kicked through the upright 
and it was good, bringing 
the score in favor of the 
Mules, 13-0.

In the second half, 
everyone got to play. Sam­
my Gonzales got into the 
end zone in the third quar­
ter on a Quarterback sneak, 
running up the score 19-0. 
Eddie Alvarado kicked the 
extra point with Joe Alva­
rado holding. This finalized 
the score, 20-0 to finish the 
game.

Offensive Standards 
were Mark Denny, Hector 
Orozco, David Pruitt, and 
Perry Flowers.

Those on defense were 
Pepe Martinez and Eugene 
Porras.

Kevin Grant had an in­
terception. and Pepe Mar­
tinez had a fumble reco­
very.

The offensive bandit this 
week was Mark Denny. On 
defense, the bandit was 
John Weurflien.

The coaches would like 
the people of Muleshoe to 
come and watch the JV 
players every Thursday. 
They are looking forward to 
a great season!

HERO To Host 
‘re-Game Supper

On September 26, in the 
High School Cafeteria, 
HERO will prepare the 
Pre-Game Supper. The 
meal will consist of chicken 
fried steak, mashed pota­
toes, green bean cassarole, 
homemade rolls and peach 
cobbler.

Serv ing time will begin at 
p.m. and tickets can be • 

purchased from any HERO 
member or at the door. The' 
money will go toward the 
organization's activities. 
Everyone is encouraged to 
come.

Juniors Meet
President Curtis Wheeler 

presided at the meeting of 
the Junior Class at 8:10 
a.m. Wednesday, Septem­
ber 17.

Homecoming is just a- 
round the corner and the 
mums are a major project 

vfor the Junior Class. Many 
actails were discussed in­
cluding the committee 
which was recently formed.

Other projects discussed 
were Halloween Carnival, 
Junior Supper, Junior- 
Senior Banquet and a pos­
sible new project that will 
be held around Thanks- 

Pgiving holidays.
The Junior Class is very 

excited about the year and 
seem to be willing to work

Sunday, September 21, 1980

Mighty ”M” 
Band

Many favorable com­
ments have been noted in 
respect to the half-time 
performances at the first 
two ball games. In addition 
to the good performance of 
the band, one reason for 
the interest is the addition 
of a flag corp to the Mighty 
"M ” Band.

The corp’s performances 
are designed to enhance 
the visual interpretation of 
the music. It takes a great 
deal of work and practice to 
achieve a precise, coor­
dinated performance.

The group working dili­
gently to provide the flag 
performances are Patty 
Garcia, Martha Flores, 
Sandra Martinez, Juanita 
Lozano, Sherry Ellard, Sta­
cey Campbell, Liberty Flo­
res, Sylvia Hodges, Stacey 
Barnhill, Robin Burgess, 
Delia Shaw and Kim Far­
mer. Robin Burgess serves 
as Flag Lieutenant and 
oversees daily rehearsals. 
Mrs. Charles (Carol) 
Faulkner works with the 
corp and assists the band 
director in coordinating the 
band and flag drills.

The corps very nice uni­
forms were made locally by 
The Dot Shop. As you may 
have noticed, performance 
flags arrived in time for the 
Morton game. The uni­
forms will be completed 
with Maribou style hats and 
plumes which are expected 
this week.

The Mighty “ M” Band 
requests the help of the 
public in keeping their 
practice field in good con­
dition. The past two foot­
ball seasons, there have 
been several people who 
have cut across the practice 
field to park near the 
southeast gate of the fence. 
Every trip across the field 
leaves lines which cause 
rehearsal problems since 
the band is very dependent 
upon good, clear lines. If 
the ground is damp, or wet, 
the cars leave ruts which 
can result in injuries to 
students.

If the cars can be kept off 
the grass, it would save 
much time and aid in the 
preparation of half-times 
and marching contests. 
Otherwise, the only solu­
tion would probably be a 
rather expensive fence. The 
Mighty "M " would greatly 
appreciate any help or co­
operation in this matter.

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Coaches
Comments

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

It took us a while to 
decide to play hard against 
Morton; but once we did, 
we were very pleased with 
the outcome of 32-7. Our 
defense once again proved 
that it does have some 
capabilities and our offense 
moved the ball very well 
and scored quite a few 
times. Induvidual Per­
formances of Marvin Lewis, 
Charles Walker, and Felix 
Norman were outstanding. 
One area of concern that 
will draw special attention 
this week is in the penalty 
catagory. We played with 
too many penalties to be 
competitive in our future 
games. The attitude of our 
entire student body has just

1980-81 HERO OFFICERS.....Newly elected officers for HERO are from left; Awyna Cox. 
parliamentarian; Sally Lunsford, first vice president; Shelli Hawkins, president; Nancy 
Garcia, treasurer; Mary Furgeson, advisor.

HERO OFFICERS....HERO elected officers for the 1980-81 school year. Pictured from left; 
Leslie Wagnon, secretary; Michelle Bryant, student council representative; Donna Hawkins, 
reporter; Jacinda Gleason, second vice president; Paula Williams, vice president of 
recreation; not pictured Lori Hartline, historian.

Active Year Planned For 
Student Council

The Muleshoe High 
School Student Council had 
their first meeting Thurs­
day. September 16, 1980 in 
the DECA room. Clifford 
Watson, President, called 
the meeting to order at 
8:05; Cara Bass said the 
prayer.

Beat tag sales were dis­
cussed. The council will be 
pushing their sales for a 
real spirited year.

A committee was formed 
to outline all the events for 
the calendar this year. The 
following people volun­
teered: Clifford Watson, 
Janet Shain. Julius Briscoe, 
Jan Whitt, Wayne Precurc, 
Laura Leal, and Cara Bass.

Seniors Meet
The Senior Class Officers 

and Sponsors met Wednes­
day, September 17, at 8 
a.m.

The Senior pre-game 
supper will be held October 
24. Ham, beans, potato 
salad, loaf bread and cob­
bler will be served.

As a Halloween project, 
the Seniors will be selling 
raffle tickets for 25 cents on 
a huge pumpkin filled with 
candy, gum and money. 
There will also be two small 
pumpkins given to the 
second and third place win­
ners. This pumpkin will be 
on display in the trophy 
case in the front hall. It will 
be given away first period 
on Thursday. October 30.

There will be a Speech 
Tournament here Novem­
ber 8, so plans are being 
made for a snackbar in the 
lunchroom.

Homecoming, October 10 
will be here soon, and the 
football sales will be un­
derway.

FHA Meeting 
Held Wednesday

FHA had an organiza­
tional meeting Wednesday, 
September 10, after school. 
Several activities planned 
for the year were 
discussed. The following 
officers were elected: Pres­
ident Linda Bell, 1st Vice 
President Beth Harmon, 
2nd Vice President Melissa 
Wagnon, 3rd Vice Presi­
dent Charlotte Morris, 4th 
Vice President Annette 
Crabtree, 5th Vice Presi­
dent Marylyn Lewis, Sec­
retary Donna Horn. Trea­
surer Ginger Morris, and 
Student Council Represen­
tative Marlea Cox. Mrs. 
Jan Powell is FHA sponsor. 
FHA uniforms will be white 
shirts. The girls will add a 
red bow and the officers are 
adding a red vest.

Projects for the year in­
clude the raffle of a black 
and white quilt, selling 
Stanley products, and sel­
ling Val-O-Grams for Val­
entine's Day.

After September 22, 
FHA will have a meeting

Also the blood drive 
which is a very important 
Student Council project will 
be coming up soon. As soon 
as definite dates are set, 
further plans will be un­
derway for a super year. 
The meeting went very well 
and the members arc exci­
ted about the school year 
1980-81.

DECA Fund 
Raiser Successful

The Muleshoe High 
School Chapter of DECA 
had a very successful Ga­
rage Sale/Car Wash last 
Saturday at the Bailey 
County Coliseum. DECA 
expresses their apprecia­
tion to everyone who dona­
ted items for the garage 
sale as well as those who 
supported us by partici­
pating in the activity.

The money will be used 
to pay Chapter dues and to 
send students to Amarillo, 
September 19 and 20 to the 
Area III Leadership Devel­
opment Conference. Stu­
dents attending this Con­
ference were Ruben Faba- 
la, Maria Flores, Bruce 
Hernandez, Janie Ibarra, 
Traci Walker. Piki Kingrey, 
Albert Lopez, Ralph San­
chez and Brenda stevens.

DECA—-Developing Fu­
ture Leaders in Marketing 
and Distribution.

★  Birthdays ★
r 22 Charles

HERO Elects Officers 
For The School Year

September 
Walker
September 24 - Janet Shain 
Max Bachicha

ree W

This year’s HERO offi­
cers include four seniors 
and four juniors. Under the 
supervision of Mrs. Mary 
Furgeson, these girls 
picked out uniforms for the 
upcoming year. The offi­
cers are as follows: Shelli 
Hawkins, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Eugene Hawkins, 
was elected as president of 
HERO. She is a senior and 
works for Joyce Shafer. She 
is active in Varsity girls’s 
basketball, FCA, FTA and 
National Honor Society. 
Shelli is presently serving 
as Area I Vice-president of 
HERO. This past summer, 
Shelli traveled to St. Louis, 
Missouri with a|l the Area 1 
officers in the state of 
Texas (60 girls total), to 
participate in the National 
Convention. Shelli has 
brought state wide atten­
tion to the Muleshoe HERO 
Chapter and HERO as a 
group is really proud of her.

Sally Lunsford, a senior, 
is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Lunsford. She 
is active in FTA and was 
elected 1st Vice-president 
of FHA/HERO. Sally is 
employed at West Plains 
Medical Center where she 
is a receptionist for Dr. 
Gregory.

Jacinda Gleason, daugh­
ter of Dr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Gleason, was elected Vice- 
president of Encounter. 
Jacinda will present a pro­
gram about Encounter to 
members in the near fu­
ture. She is a junior and is 
active in FTA. She is em­
ployed at Dr. David Ham­
blen’s dentist office.

HERO
Attends
Workshop

HERO will attend a 
workshop to be held in 
Earth September 23. The 
topics for the workshop will 
be “UP MEMBERSHIP 
AND HEALTHY BABIES” . 
The members of HERO will 
be involved in the teaching 
of these programs for the 
workshop. Each topic will 
have 3 sections so that 
everyone involved can par­
ticipate on each topic.

The members attending 
will be Shelli Hawkins, 
Sally Lunsford, Awyna Cox, 
Nancy Garcia, Shelly Davis. 
Denna Harris, Marilyn 
Harris. Lori Butler. Mary 
Burton, Larry Lopez. Kevin 
Robinson, Donna Hawkins, 
Michelle Bryant, Orpha 
Pecina, Debra Pecina, and 
Lori Hartline.

We wish these girls suc­
cess in the workshop.

★  Attention ★
Memory Mates are now 

on sale by the annual staff. 
They include one 5X7 team 
photo and one 4X5 photo of 
the individual player. 
These are available for both . 
varsity and JV players. 
These sell for S7.50 and are 
on sale in room 5, first and 
fourth periods or by calling 
Mrs. Smith at MHS or 
contacting any staff mem­
ber.

Band, basketball and 
football Memory Mates

Elected Vice-president of 
Recreation was Paula Wil­
liams. Paula is a junior and 
the daughter of Mary Wil­
liams. She is working at the 
newly opened "Expres­
sions” located in the new 
Mini Mall on American 
Boulevard. Mrs. Mary Wil­
liams is the owner of the 
new gift shop.

Parliamentarian for the 
’80-’81 year is Awyna Cox, 
the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. David Cox. She is 
active in FTA, and is a 
senior. Awnya is employed 
by West Plains Medical 
Center.

Elected as Secretary was 
Leslie Wagnon, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Mack 
Wagnon. Leslie is secretary 
of FTA, District XVII Sec­
retary of FTA, and Head

National 
Honor Society

The National Honor 
Society met Wednesday, 
September 10. to elect of­
ficers for the year. Those 
elected were President Ke- 
va Roming, Vice President 
Carroll Precure, Secretary- 
Treasurer Lynnette Shafer, 
Chaplain Clifford Watson, 
Student Council Represen­
tative and Reporter Shelli 
Hawkins, Parliamentarian 
Bryce Holmes, and Co- 
Bulletin Board Chairman 
Brenda Stevens and Carla 
Shafer.

The next meeting will be 
held October 10 at 6:30. 
Members will be contacted 
on where the meeting will 
be held. All members need 
to be present as several 
activities are being planned 
for the year.

Varsity Cheerleader. She is 
employed at the First Na­
tional Bank under the su­
pervision of Maxine Don­
aldson.

Nancy Garcia, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Garcia, was elected to the 
office of Treasurer. Nancy 
is active in FTA, Student 
Council, and National Hon­
or Society. Her employer is 
Buddy Blackman of 
Buddy's Shoe Store.

Donna Hawkins, a junior 
and daughter of Margie 
Hawkins, is active in FTA 
and was elected reporter. 
She is employed at Mule­
shoe Country Club Pro 
Shop.

Lori Hartline, elected 
Historian, is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hart­
line. Lori works at West 
Plains Medical Center 
under the direction of Art 
Willey in the Respiratory 
unit. She is active in FTA 
and is a junior.

Student Council Repre­
sentative is Michelle Bry­
ant. Michelle is a junior and 
is active in FTA. She is 
employed by West Plains 
Medical Center under the 
supervision of Marshall 
Cook.

Monday 22 -  Volleyball- 
Bovina. there 5:00; School 
dismissed at 2:15, South 
Plains Fair
Tuesday 23 -  Beginning at 
8:40 Vision Checks 
Wednesday 24 -  Beginning 
at 8:40 Vision Checks 
Thursday 25 -• Hereford, 
9th and JV 5:30, 7:00 
Friday 26 — Idalou-herc- 
8:00, HECE Supper

ADAM LARADO A MARGIE HA WKINS

HERO Employer 
& Employee 

Of The Month 

r ^ ^ ^ e ^ c h o o ^ J e a m ?
1980-81, HERO will choose 
an Employer/Employee of 
the month. The member 
will nominate at the be­
ginning of each month em­
ployers to be selcted. When 
nominating an employer 
each student will cite ex­
amples of outstanding ser­
vice, leadership, and spe­
cial consideration for em­
ployees shown during the 
past month by the emplo­
yer. This month's selection 
of Employer/Employee of 
the month is Margie Haw­
kins, manager of the Dairy 
Queen. Adam Laredo is

for eight years and during 
this time, she has had 
several HECE students 
employed. She has five 
daughters, one son, and 
nine grandchildren. HECE 
would like to thank Mrs. 
Hawkins for outstanding 
service and support of our 
program.

Adam Laredo is a senior 
and is an active member of 
the Muleshoe High School 
Band. Adam is also a 
member of FHA/HERO.

Congratulations to Mar­
gie and Adam from the 
students of HECE.

Trial And Error
He who nevdr makes a 

mistake actually never 
makes a discovery either.

•Grit.
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Muleshoe
School
Lunch
September 22-26 

MONDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Cereal, Fruit 
LUNCH

Milk
Steaks
Gravy
Creamed Potatoes 
Green Beans 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

TUESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Pancakes, Syrup, 
Juice

LUNCH
Milk

Hamburgers 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Pickles & Onions 
French Fries 
Fruit Cobbler

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Toast, Jelly, Juice 
LUNCH

Milk

Last
S older jo in ts , rem ove  
paint, m ore. Ideal for 
hom e im provem ents &  
hobbies. W ith  d o g -  
proof pin-point burner. 
UL listed MM555-65

401 S. 1st.
Muleshoe
272-4511

SEPTEMBER 22-26

MONDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Toasted Buns with honey, 
Juice, Milk

LUNCH
Bar B Que on a Bun
Tater Tots 
Tossed Salad 
Jello with Fruit 
Milk

TUESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Bacon, Eggs, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH

Fish with Tarter Sauce 
French Fries 
Green Beans 
Hot Rolls 
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Do-nuts, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH 

Pizza Dogs 
Com
Mashed Potatoes
Applesauce
Milk

THURSDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Toast, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH 

Pinto Beans
Macaroni with Tomatoes
Spinach
Cake
Milk

FRIDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Waffles, Syrup, Juice, Milk 
LUNCH 

Cheeseburgers 
French Fries 
Lettuce, Onions 
Tomatoes, Pickles 
Cookies 
Milk

Remember Now 
So You Can 

Remember Then.
A  Professional

8 x 10 Color Portrait 
For 88 Cents

In addition to our 
Regular Offer,

Now You Can 
Get An 

Exciting 10x13 
Dual-Image 

Portrait!
Ask photographer 

for details.

Sept. 23and24
Tues.: 10a.m.-6p.m. 
Wed.: 10 a.m .-5 p.m.

303 Main Street Muleshoe

l - M : \ - m
88< per sitting. No charge for additional group 
subjects. One special per person. Backgrounds 
may occasionally change. Remember, children 

must be accompanied by parent. Satisfaction always 
or vour money cheerfully refunded.

SHOP 
early;
FOR ^
CHRISTMAS!

Pork Patties 
Blackeyed Peas 
Whole Potatoes 
Corn Bread 
Fruit Jello

THURSDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Honey Buns, Juice 
LUNCH

Milk
Pizza
Mixed Vegetables
Pickles
Cookies
Fruit

FRIDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Oatmeal, Toast, Fruit 
LUNCH

Milk 
Frito Pie 
Pinto Beans 
Cole Slaw 
Corn Bread 
Fruit Cup

Preferred
‘‘Your fiance is a charm­

ing man. He has a certain 
something.”

"Yes, but 1 would rather 
he had something certain ”

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Jo Ed Noel and Belinda 
Jeanne Bullock, both of 
Petersburg

WARRANTY DEEDS
Elias Noe Anzaldua, Jr. 

and wife, Viola B. Anzaldua 
to Gabino Guillen and wife, 
Esperanza—-All of Lot (12) 
in Block No. (35), Original 
Town of Muleshoe.

D.E. Beller and wife, 
Zora Mae Beller to Dr. 
Jerry Don Gregory and 
wife, Linda Charline Greg­
ory—-A tract of land out of 
the (N/2) of Section Num­
ber (33), Block Y, WD 
& FW Johnson's Subdivi­
sion No. 2, Bailey County, 
Texas.

Winona L. Jordan to 
Muleshoe Bancsharcs, Inc. 
of Muleshoe—-All of the 
Northeasterly ('/i) of All of 
Lot Numbers (1), (2). (3),

(4) and (5), Block No. (5), 
Original Town of Mule­
shoe.

COUNTY COURT
Julia Noron Alarcon ■ 

Assault - S15 Fine.
Casimiro Muniz - Carry­

ing a Handgun - $25 Fine.
Jerry Berry - Worthless 

Check • $32 Fine.
L.S. Chancey - Worthless 

Check - $5 Fine.
Isabel Ornelas, also 

known as Manuel Ornelas - 
Order of Dismissing De­
fendant From Misdemea­
nor Probation.

Thomas Don Dulin - Or­
der of Dismissal.

Ynes M. Aleman - Ordef
of Dismissal.

Norman R. Tusck - Theft- 
$150 Fine - 30 Days Jail.

Five Area Telephone Co­
operative, Inc. VS Ket- 
cheraid Construdtion Com- 
33ny Inc. - Motion To 
Jismiss.

Proof Positive
Friend-So you are really 

happily married?
Young Wife-Yes, we 

have actually postponed our 
divorce three times.

Definition
Bore-A person who 

keeps you from beinjf 
lonely-when you wish you 
were.

•Irish Digest.

£fhanb OJou

W h e n  A m e r i c a n  banker 
Am adeo Peter G iannin i died 
in  1 9 4  9 , t h e  B a n k  o f  
Am erica — which be began 
as the Bank o f Ita ly  — had 
become the world's largest 
u n i n c o r p o r a t e d  b a n k .

. . . the 
24 hour 

bank
Sin^leton-Ellis F uneral Home 
21 Hour Ambulance Service

wtsk to express our thanks to art
dm  {Mends uiho have been so kind and tkuqhtfrt 
duMnq the floss art fa#d one, Qlfbert QAJenner. 
QJartfrtaije«.ijartifclis. uietke* bq card. phone or
in person ardipur wads c{ fa# a*d $t|w|*itkj am
a# appreciated and haw made out floss easte* to 
bow.

Ains.

Airs. QlCbert QAJenner 
‘Dowfld Cyjenner

and A irs. Steve Qisenhaer 
A ir. and A irs. ^Defter Renner 
J ta  and A irs. Qeafard Renner 
oUt and A irs. AnoeQ Ashjprd 
Qalph Renner

k'f

P  MULESHOE 
STATE BANK

P h .2 7 2 - 1 \ M uleshoe
101 AMERICAN BLVD • 272-4561 • Member FDIC

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD
517 S. First 
Rev. Joe Stone 
EMMANUEL BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Em m anuel 
107 E Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor 
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST 
CHURCH
17th and W est Ave. D 
Roy L. Sjkes, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
Rev. Ynes Aleman 
East Third and Ave. E 
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 Ave. B

LONGVIEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Pastor B.C. Sronecipher 
Phone 946-3413
SIXTEENTH AND AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Sunday • 10:30 a .m .
Evening • 6 p .m .
W ednesday • 8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH
Progress, Texas
Rev. Cecil O sborne , Pastor
NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina 
UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH 
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor 
MULESHOE BAPTIST 
CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd. Pastor 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E 
Rev. J .E .  Meeks

I DON’T SEE ANYTHING”
THERE IS ONLY ONE W AY TO SEE THROUGH A CAMERA

Did you ever try to look through a camera from the front side? Yes, most of us have. . .  
out of curiosity. . .  but we would not even consider trying to take a picture in such a 
manner.-'Therr are mwny-though, who g* through life never giving themselves a chance
to really see God. In order to see God, one must look at him through faith. Attend church 
regularly, seek God where others can help direct you in your search for God.

“So then faith eometh by hearing, and hearing by the word of God."

Living Word Teaching Center
1200 Block American Blvd.
Sunday 10 A.M. Thursday 7:30 p.m. 
Eric King • Pastor

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE
Ninth and Ave. C 
Dana Shunko, Pastor 
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W . Ave. G.
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a .m .
W orship 11:00 a.m .
LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST Mlaalon 
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor 
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
H.D. H unter ,  Pastor 
Morton Highway 
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Jam es  Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH
Clifford Slay, Pastor
1st and 3rd Sundays
FIRST UNITED METHODIST
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin 
507 W est Second, M uleshoe 
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a .m .
Worship Services 
hi :00 a.m .

T i r m p r i v E  b a p t i s t  c h u r c h
621 South First 
Elder Bernard  Gowens 
MULESHOE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
David Cox, minister 
Clovis Highway
JEHOVA w i t n e s s
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, M inister 
IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH
Father Patrick M ahar 
Northeast of City in Morrison 
Edition

ST. MATHEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Corner of W est Boston &
West Birch
Rev. M.S. Brown. Pastor

Muleshoe Home 
Center, Inc.

Attend The Service!4 Of Your Choice P^DaiuJ
kQ ueen

.Margie Hawkins 
v  Manager

272-3412

Watson Alfalfa
! 272-3552 272-4038

Muleshoe Co-Op 
Gins

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

402 Main
’W h e re  Friends M e e t  a n d  P rice s T a lk ”

Western Sprinklers
_V Inc. W.Hwy.84
ZIMMATIC 272-4544

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-1288

Robert Green Inc.
YourOldgmobile,GMC, Pontiac, 

Buirk Dealer
W.Hwy.84 272-1588

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co.

John Deere Dealer 
Mulenhoe 272-4297

Western Drug
114 Main

Main Street Beauty Kemp's Discount Muleshoe
___ 11_1 1*_1 »___c?_ Muleshoe Body
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Dtadliaa For Classified Ads Is 11:00 
Tuesdays Aid Fridays

CLASSIFIED RATES
1st Insertion,

Per Word s. 15 
Minimum Charge-- 

$2.00
2nd Insertion,
Per word-S. 13 
3rd Insertion,

Per Word-S. 10 
Minimum Charge 

SI. 80
1/3 Cheaper to run

Classifieds 3 times or more 
CARD OF THANKS 

25 words-S3 
Over 25 words 

charged at regular 
classified rates 

Classified Display- 
Si. 55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

II a. m. Tues. for Thurs. 
II a. m. Fri. for Sun.
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

ANY AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 

AFTER AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

1. PERSONALS

AREA LUTHERAN 
AGENCY ANNOUNCES 

ADOPTION INTAKT 
The Panhandle South 
Plains Office of the Luth­
eran Social Service of Texas 
is inviting couples interes­
ted in adoption to contact 
the agency during the 
month of September. Each 
of the eight LSST offices 
opens "INTAKE" one 
month per year for families 
interested in adopting 
Anglo children, ages 0-8 
years. The number of fami­
lies accepted for study is 
determined by the volume 
of referrals anticipated for 
the following year for Anglo 
children. Couples seeking 
to adopt should have no 
more than one child in the 
home and be under the age 
of forty. The agency ac­
cepts inquiries from 
couples of all racial, reli­
gious and ethnic back­
grounds.
It should be noted that 
intake is always open to 
families wishing to adopt 
Anglo children over the age 
of eight, Mexican American 
school-age children, Black 
or mixed Black children of 
any age, including infants 
and children or any ethnic 
or racial background who 
are slow learners, emo­
tionally disturbed or physi­
cally handicapped. For 
such adoptions there are no 
restrictions concerning the 

B family size or age.
Interested families should 
contact Lutheran Social 
Service, in writing, at 2412 
13th Street. Lubbock. Tex­
as. 79401.
1^6^8tc__________ _

MARTIN ROOFING 
All Work Gnaranteed

Butch Martin 
1923 South First Street 
! Phone 806-272-5360 
M uleshoe, Texa* 79347 
1-1 la-tfc

RHETA WHITE STUDIO 
TRADEWINDSMALL 

8th AND WEST 
AMERICAN BLVD.

Art classes for adult be­
ginners. Basic drawing, 
composition, and perspec­
tive. September 22-25. 
Children's classes Septem­
ber 22-25; 4:15 6:15. Call 
272-3889 after 6 or write 
Box 348, Muleshoe. Texas,

WE BUY
, USED FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
1-18s-tfc

COTTON 
DEFOLIATION 

Ron Kidd 
965-2262 

or
272-3705 

Ground Rigs 
l-38s-9tc

SS TOP DOLLAR SS 
Cash paid for GOLD Rings, 
Sterling Silver, diamonds, 
Coins, Stereo Equipment, 
CB’s, TVs, Tapes, Knives, 
Ski Equipment, anything of 
value. BENBROOK DIS­
COUNT TRADING CO. in 
VILLAGE behind VILLAGE 
BARBER SHOP. 7th and 
Main 505-762-0! 11, Clovis. 
New Mexico.
1 -38s-tfc
.........................................V ................................................

Public Notice
NOTICE TO ALL 

PERSONSHAVING 
CLAIMS A GAINST THE 

ESTATE OF 
RALPH E. ETHRIDGE 

DECEASED
Notice is hereby given 

that Original Letters of 
Administration for the 
Estate of Ralph E. Ethridge 
were issued on the 16th day 
of January, 1980, in Cause 
No. 1371, pending in the 
County Court of Bailey 
County, Texas, to: 

MILDRED LOIS 
ETHRIDGE

The residence of such 
Community Administrator 
is Bailey County, Texas. 
The post office address is: 

1533 W. A VE. C 
MULESHOE. TEXAS 79347 

All persons having 
claims against this Estate 
which is currently being 
administered are required 
to present them within the 
time and in the manner 
prescribed by law.

DATED this 17th day of 
September. 1980.
Jack D. Young (signature) 
l-38s- ltc

3. HELP WANTED

The Texas Migrant Coluncil 
is accepting applications for 
Center-Director.
Call 272-3992 
3-35s-tfc

Experienced farm hand 
needed. Please call 
806-965-2344 before 7 a.m. 
or after 9 p.m.
3-35s-tfc

JOB HUNTING?
We may have what you’re 
looking for.
Texas Employment Office 

112 W. A ve. B 
2 V  7760

Lonnie Merriott. Manager
3-3In ilc

HELPED WANTED: Need 
some one to work full time 
in bookkeeping and tax 
service. Must have some 
accounting knowledge. Ex­
perience helpful. Call 
Winston Allison at 
272-3267 for appointment. 
3-38t-4tc

Beauticians needed imme­
diately. Call 272 3448. 
3-33s-tfc

HELP WANTED: New KLS 
Steakhousc taking applica­
tions through Wednesday. 
Cook’s helper, dishwasher, 
waitresses, and bus boys. 
West Highway 84. next to 
Ranch House Motel.

INSURANCE AGENTS 
UNION FIDELITY LIFE

Needs general agents in the 
state of Texas. Add to your 
portfolio our money making 
Medicare All Star Plans 
and our A&H and Life 
Plans. We offer:
1. High commissions
2. Lifetime vested renew­
als
3. Fast issue, within 72 
hours
4. Liberal underwriting
5. Prompt & efficient claim 
service
6. Immediate banking au­
thority — every day is pay 
day
For confidential telephone 
interview call TOLL FREE 
1-800-874-7870 between 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. EST.
3-38s-ltp

Needed a baby sitter in my 
home for 2 month old baby. 
Call 272-5021 after 5 p.m.
3- 38s-tfc

4. HOUSES FOR RENT

Large trailer space for rent. 
Call 272-3071 after 6 p.m.
4- 38s-tfc

7. WANTED TO RENT

WANTED: irrigated farm 
land to rent for 1981. Call 
Tom Little Farms 272-3802 
or 272-4086.
7- 36t-6tc

8. REAL ESTATE

ACREAGE: FOR SALE: 10 
acres, '/a mile off freeway, 
north of Wilson Drilling Co. 
Country living close to 
town. Lays good. Would 
make ideal home-site. Call 
272-3879.
8- 36s-tfc

We want your business 
“remember” 

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID 

272-3142 
George Nieman 

965-2488 
Dianne Nieman 

965-2488 
Lucille Harp 

2.2-4693
Extra nice brick home in 
Richland Hills Addition. 
3-2-2 with fireplace.

Approximately 1527 sq. 
ft. of living area, with 
isolated master bed­
room, and cathedral 
ceiling in den. P- ed in 
the 40's......
Extra large brick home 
in Richland Hills area. 
Furniture included with 
this sale!!

We currently have two 
brick homes under con­
struction.

10 lots in Progress with 
well and septic tanks. 
Approximately 2 acres.

Will trade 40 acres for 
nice home in Muleshoe.

Check with us on your 
commercial property 
needs.

FARMS

146 acres, one 8" well, 
one 10” well, center 
pivot goes with it.

426 acre alfalfa farm. 3
center pivots, 3 side- 
rolls, 6 • 6” wells.

190 acres, 2 wells, cen­
ter pivot, nice brick 
home.

SUDDERTH 
REALTY INC.

Box 627 
109 Fifth St. 

Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone \806] 481-3288 

or 481-9149

160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good on FM highway.

320 acres irrigated with 
2 electric wells and 
circles all wheat, fenced 
excellent water area. 
Near Bovina Feeders.

160 acres irrigated, cir­
cle sprinkler, 2 wells. 
200 ft. water, plus 3 
bedroom house, new 
steel barn, on highway 
northwest of Muleshoe.

320 acres Bailey County^ 
2 circle sprinklers. Four 
8” and one 6” wells. 12 
miles west of Muleshoe 
on FM highway 1760. 
Lay excellent.

1285 acres, circle 
sprinklers, 7-8 inch 
wells, corrals and feed 
pens, trailer house. 
Priced to sell. Owner 
will finance. 29 percent 
down or will take cash.

60acres east of Mule­
shoe. One 8”  well side 
row sprinkler, 3 small 
barns, all irrigation e- 
quipment goes. Priced 
to sell.

320 acres near Lazbud- 
die, excellent water 
area, 2 - 8" wells and 
one 6” well without 
pump. One leased cir­
cular sprinkler. Priced 
for immediate sale. 
8-38t-tfc

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
P h . 272-3191 

APPRAISALS 
8-18t-tfc

TOWN and 
COUNTRY

R E A L  E S T A T E

3 bedroom brick, double 
garage. 2 bath. 1916 W. 
Ave. H. $55,000.

3 bedroom, brick, single 
garage, 2 bath, new 
paint and carpet. 1920 
W. Ave. E. $38,500.

3 or 4 bedroom. Car 
port, 2 bath, stucco. 518 
W. 7th St. $35,000.

Richland Hills lot. 103 
foot, front on West Ave. 
H.

8-35t-tfc

FARMS RANCMft HOMES
JOHN W. SMITH, S,ofc«<

806 273.4678

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

232 Main 272-4838 
Joe and Ricky 

Smallwood

96 acres, 3 miles north­
west of Mjleshoe. Gif­
ford-Hill electric sprin­
kler.

Large 2 bedroom, 1 
bath, brick house. Good 
location.

1974 mobile home. 2 
bedroom, 1 bath, to be 
moved.

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 
Richland Hills, everything
PLUS. 1907 W. Ave. G.
272-4701
8-27t-tfc

FOR SALE: Lot #6 Block #8 
Pool Addition, replat. 125 X 
75, 600 block facing Ave. K 
Call 272-4536.

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom, 2 
bath, large den with fire­
place. 322 W. 5th. Call Rex 
Black 272-3431.
8- 36s-6tc

9. AUTOMOBILES
FOR SALE

FOR SALE: 1978 Chevrolet 
pickup. Long, wide, 4X4, 
clean. Lots of extras. Call 
272-4408 or see at 410 
North First.
9- 37s-tfc

10. FARM EQUIP. 
FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Early harvest 
cotton seperator basket. I- 
deal for bole buggy. Call 
272-5309 or 385-4597.
10- 38t-tfc

FOR SALE: 484 John Deere 
Stripper, 1978 model. Low 
hours (nice). Ready to 
move. Call 806-965-2344. 
10-36s-tfc

FOR SALE: House and 2 
lots. Call 272-3923. 
8-28s-sth

USED EQUIPMENT

We now have in stock: 
’75 J.D. 7700 Combine 
'72 J.D. 7700 Combine 
‘75 I.H. 915 Combine 

J.D. 4430 Tractors 
J.D. 4630 tractor 
J.D. 4440 Tractor 
J.D. 4520 Tractor 
J.D. 4620 Tractor 

3-Case 1370 Tractors 
with dulls 
Case 970 Tractors 
J.D. 4010 Tractor with 
stripper
J.D. Three drill hitch 
with 3-8200 drills 

J.D. Bulldozer for 4630 
J.D. One way and 

sweep plows 
J.D. - l.H. - N.H. 

Balers
"WE BUY. SELL AND 
TRADE USED EQUIP­
MENT. ”

Cal Jordan Implement 
Clovis, N.M.
15051 763-5517

11. FOR SALE

needs call: FOR SALE 160 acres loca-
GLAZE & GOFORTH ted 5 miles from Muleshoe

112 Ave. C on Plain view Highway, 'A
272-4208 mile south, 100 acres alfal-

8-11-tfc fa. 60 acres grass, 6" well.

FOR SALE BY OWNER
Three bedroom, 1 'A baths 
living room, den, carpeted 
throughout, new roof, 
with large bedrooms. Call 
John Blackwell 247-2729 
or 272-4574.

lers. Phone 806-657-4672 or 
806-799-8494.
Il-38s-2tc

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
1954 Chevy pickup. Call 
272-3817.

-II 5bt-4tn_____________

Rent-to-Own 
Color TV

W a fe rs  Dryers Refrige, ators
N o S r n ic r  Exfu ’tittv No In lc n ’st To / ViV

F r e e  T o  A l l

FOR SALE: No. I alfalfa 
seed, cleaned in 50 lb. bag. 
James Jansa 817-552-6018. 
15-34s-8tc

Don and Darrell McDaniel 
Custom manure hauling. 
806-272-4817 or 272-3551. 
Hauling from King's Feed 

Lot.
15-37t-8tp

CUSTOM CORN 
OR

MAIZE HARVESTING 
Vernon Carter, phone 806 
364-8370. 30 or 40 inch 
heads, 4 trucks, 2 
edmbines.
15-37s-4tp

FRESH HONEY FOR SALE 
Nick Landers 
334 W. Ave. J  

Muleshoe. Texas 
272-3096 

15-33s-tfc

WANT YOUR OLD 
BRICKS HAULED OFF? 
Youth activities needs 
bricks for the miniature golf 
course, will pick up I to 100 
or more. To donate, call 
272-4051 or 272-4536. 
l5-26t-tfc

FOR SALE 1978, 4 door 
Datsun 810. $5300.00. Also 
30 inch Frigidaire Electric
Range. $75.00.
272-4319.
15-32s-tfc

Call

I Lady Bee at Earth is
j now carrying

SCULPTRESS BRAS.
Call 252-3748.

j 15-2bs-stfc

Betty Parrish's Needlepoint 
classes at the Knick-Knack 
Shack will begin October 
14. Call 257-3511 to enroll. 
Come by to choose your 
yarn colors before October 
9. For classes or yarn in 
Dimmitt, call 647-3287. 
J5-36s-5tc
FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Used 14X75 Astro Mobile 
Home to be moved. 2 
bedroom, 1 3/4 bath and 
fireplace. Call 806-825-2618
I l-38s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1978 John 
Deere 484 four row cotton 
stripper. 1978 Bush-Hog 
Module Builder. Call 
272-3802 or 272-4086.
I I -36t-6tc

Check with SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE.
15-30s-tfc

Puppies to give away. Part 
German Shepherd.
Call 272-4153 before 8 a.m. 
or after 7 p. m. 
l5-36s-tfc

We do electrical wiring for 
residents, motors and mo­
tor controls, underground 
faults, industrial wiring. 
Call 272-5521 
15-30s-tfc

He that has more knowl­
edge than judgment is 
made for another 
man's use more than
his own.

-William Penn.

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
118 W. Ave. C 

In the rear 
Phone 272-4255 

12-39s-tfc

FOR SALE: Tomatoes, bell 
peppers and okra. Go 4 
miles west on 1760, 1 mile 
north, 1/4 mile back west. 
Robert and Frankie Luns­
ford. Call 272-3748.
1 l-37t-tfc
........................................... f -
Sweet potatoes, $6 per 
bushel. 301 Bell Street. 
Amherst.
15-38s-tfc

FOR SALE: 450 portable 
M&W corn dryer, $6,000. 
238-1605.
1 l-37t-6tc

Texaco Service Station for 
lease. Call 272-4688. 
13-38s-tfc

No Cooperation
"Look here, private, this 

man beside you on fatigue 
detail is doing twice the work 
you are."

"1 know, sarge. That's 
what I've been telling him for 
the last hour, but he won't 
slow down."

*  •  *  *

One of the troubles 
with this old world is that 
it is packed with people 
telling other people what 
to do. • * * *

Teamwork succeeds 
when both horses pull.

TRA DE WINDS PLAZA 
A few custom designed 
retail or office space 
left. Now's the time to 
put in that shop you 
always dreamed of (re­
gardless of size). Come 
down to 800 W. Ameri­
can Blvd. and let us 
show you around and 
acquaint you with our 
growing family of 
friendly shop owners. 
Wc believe you w ill like 
what you see and agree 
that this is the place to 
start a business. Call 
272-5180 or 965-2471. 
13-30t-tfc

m ru iL —t  fl A N T M Q c O

SALES HELP NEEDED:
Full time tales position opening in the 

ladies department a t Anthony's. You must be 
mature, dependable, responsible, permanent, 
and productive.

Company benefits include sales bonuses, 
employee discount, paid hofidays and vacations, 
insurance, profits sharing, and retirement.

Apply in person Monday, Tuesday, or 
Wednesday morning from 9 to 11 a.m.

321 MAIN STREET* MULESHOE, TEXAS

h o n ifL -------
A N f  M O N V C Q

JAMES C. DOBSON, Ph.D.

FOCUS the FAMILY
FILM SERIES

B E G IN N IN G  SEPTEM BER  21, 1980
6:30 p.m.

September 21
Film No. 1 — The Strong-Willed Child 

September 28
Film No. 2 — Shaping the Will Without Breaking the Spirit 

October 5
r  Film No. 3 — Christian Fathering

October 12
Film No. 4 — Preparing for Adolescence: The Origins 

r \ V h \  f  \ -fC of Self-Doubt
October 19

U  , /  Him No. 5 — Preparing for Adolescence: Peer Pressure
and Sexuality

October 26
Film No. 6 -  What Wives Wish Their Husbands Knew 

About Women — The lamely Housewife
November 2

)4rj  Film No. 7 — What Wives Wish Their Husbands Knew 
11 About Women Money, Sex and Children

MULESHOE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

21st & American Blvd.
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HORMEL'S SUPER SELECT FRESH PORK
FAMILY PACK

P O R K  C H O P S  
P O R K  STEAKs  
H O T L I N K S s  
W IE N E R S
C D  A  I U  I f  Q  OSCAR MAYER!  
■ “  H  111 l \ « l  REG OR JUMBC

B O L O G N A  "
U  A  | U |  OSCAR MAYER llnlll SLICEDCOO KFD..................

PORK

W R IG H T ’S HICKORY SM OKED

SLAB SLICED

BACON i,
GREEN GIANT KITCHEN SLICED 
OR FRENCH STYLE .a?l KRAFT GREENIPA R K A Y pkI  

‘QUARTERS
16  OZ. 
CANS

FQLGER’S
INSTANT

D l l U P A D D I  C d e l m o n t e -.! r l l l t r t r r L C  s l i/ c r u / c h k

U  A  M  UNDERWOOD'S  
M M I f l  d e v il e d

S L O P P Y  JOEyf 
S A U S A G E  VIENNA1
TEA  B A G S  CINT/LEMOl 

C O C O A  INSTANT^

L E M O N A D E
S p r a y  &  W a s h

B A G G IE S  ̂ SDWICH
A * \  STEAK

■ SAUCE .................. ..............

C O F F E E folgersw  W  l l b b  CRYSTALS

S O U R  C R E A M  
S H E R B E T 'S ^ ;
M IL K s® #*
C O B B LER S
C O O K -N -B A G

OR DIPS 
BORDEN'S 2V4 OZ 

CANS

5 OZ 
CANS

MORTON
ASSORTED

TEXIZE • 16 OZ
STAIN REMOVER CAN

GLADIOLA 
ALL PURPOSE

8 0  CT 
BOX

I FLOUR
i 3 0 ‘ OFF LABEL

i Pa lm o l iv e  l Liqu id  4n

STAYFREE

WHITE CLOUD 
BATHROOMPADS

TISSUE• ^ c l l  PAIN RELIEF

i^BUFFERIN
^ T a b l e t s

1 1 | BRONZE DEODORANT

saRIGHT 
GUARD 5cS

TAB, FRESCA OR

COCA-COLA
DEODORANT STICK-BRONZE

RIGHT  
GUARD 2.5 OZ 

STICK 2 LITER 
BTL.

NEW  CROP 
GOLDEN DELICIOUS

’ Start* Sept. 28. 1980
GUNN i j
A i )  D oub le

' 1 ^  Barreled
^ bros . ^  Special
Z  STAMP BOOKLET

WORTH %  BOOK
WHEN FILLED WITH

30 "BIG 10"
Gunn Bros. Stamps
REDEEM FOR DOUBLE BARRELED SPECIALS AT

COME TO PAY N-SAVE 
FOR YOUR WIC 

CARD PURCHASES

We Welcome 

USDAFOOD 

STAMPS COUPONS

COLORADO

J  TEXAS

*  r 'J C U M B E R S
W E RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTIT€SEAST TEXAS PRICES EFFECTIVE SEPTEMBER 81-87,1980

2 0 c OFF LABEL

DISH
ALL

HEALTH AND BEAUTY AIDS

PR E P R IC E D  s2  3 9 ® '

PUNCH*
D etergent

BOUNTY

PAPER JU M B O  
ROLL ,

TOWELS

Q U A L I T Y  AN D  S E R V I C E


