
»

r or@D!‘ n C err 
1 . 0 . Box 68

WEATHER
November 21 70 21
November 22 44 19
November 23 45 19
November 24 56 20
M oisture to Date: 16.93
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Mules Win Bi-District ; Childress Next
4i Jjh

Shaw, Gleason Given 
High 4-H Gold Star
Outstanding youths from 

20 South Plains counties 
were saluted and challen­
ged to continue to achieve

M uleshoe Area Youth Ac­
tivities Committee, Inc. 
will meet at 6:30 p.m. on 
Monday, November 26 at 
the Bailey County Exhibi­
tion Center and Coliseum.

All members and other 
interested individuals are 
encouraged to attend the 
meeting.

The Muleshoe ISD Board 
of Trustees will meet in 
special session at 8 p.m. 
Monday at the school ad­
ministration office.
They will review creden­

tials of the applicants for 
the position of Superinten­
dent of Schools in Mule­
shoe and will discuss on 
site visits made by five 
school board members.

SBA Disaster 

Office Opens 

Again Friday
Representatives of the 

Small Business Adminis­
tration Disaster office will 
be in several communities 
each week, beginning the 
week of November 26, to 
receive completed SBA Di- 
aster Loan Program with 

farmers,  ranchers and ot­
ter  people in farm-related 
jusinesses who sustained 
troduction losses resulting 
or disastrous weather dur- 
ng 1979, said a SBA 
pokesman.
The representatives will 
ie in Muleshoe each Fri- 
ay from 3-4 p.m. at the 
ailey County Courthouse 

i the commissioners 
ourtroom.
Eligible counties covered 
y these representatives 
re Parmer,  Bailey, Coch­
in, Yoakum, Gaines, Ter- 
', Hale. Lamb, Swisher, 
astro, Floyd, Lubbock 
id Hockley.

and accept leadership at 
the annual District Two 
4-H Gold Star Banquet in 
Lubbock Monday night.

Forty boys and girls rece­
ived the highest county 
award offered in the 4-H 
Club program-the  Gold 
Star Award-a t  the ban ­
quet at Coronado High 
School. With it, each youth 
received the acclaim of 
parents,  fellow 4-H’ers, 
government officials, Ex­
tension leaders and other 
community leaders.

Honored from Bailey Co­
unty were Delia Shaw, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Shaw of Muleshoe 
and Jimmy Gleason, son of 
Dr. and Mrs. Jerry Glea­
son, also of Muleshoe.

John T. Montford, Lub­
bock criminal district at tor­
ney, challenged the award 
recipients to continue to 
accept roles of responsi ­
bility as they become ad­
ults.

Montford gave the 
4-H’ers “ four R’s ”  to re­
member to help them con­
tinue to be good leaders. 
The key words, he said, 
are retain, resist, respect 
and responsibility.
He urged them to retain 

the fundamental  values 
they already have formed. 
“ Your her itage,”  he said, 
“ stems from what has 
been the backbone of our 
nation, the family uni t .” 
And he said 4-H is based 
on the values of the prod­
uctive, cooperative family.

Resisting peer pressure 
brings to the forefront the 
strongest  aspect of leader­
ship ability, the district 
attorney said. “ Saying 
‘no’ is not always the 
popular thing, but it may 
be the right th ing,”  he 
noted.

Respect for the law, “ the 
very foundation of our so­
ciety,”  is also needed,  
Montford said. “ The place 
to change the laws is in the 
legislative process,”  he 
stressed.

“ Accept the responsibi­
lity the future holds for 
you,”  he urged.  “ Through 
your leadership, w e’ll re­
gain our self-sufficiency” 
Cont. page 6, Col. 2
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BI-DISTRICT CHAMPION MULES---Immediately following the Muleshoe-Idalou District Championship game in
Plainview Friday afternoon, the Muleshoe Mules were presented the trophy designating their championship.  Here 
jubilant Mules hold the trophy high in the air, as head football coach Mike Wartes,  second from right, looks on. 
Also shown in the forefront second from left, is coach Steve Taylor. Next Friday night, the Mules will take on the 
Childress Bobcats at Canyon for the Regional Championship.  They hope to reverse the loss to Childress for 
regional last year.

Parade And Bazaar 
Highlight Weekend

Next Saturday, December 
1, plan to make it a day in 
Muleshoe for the activities 
planned to kick off the 
Christmas season here.

At 2 p.m. Saturday, a 
parade is scheduled for 
downtown Muleshoe. It is 
sponsored by the Mule­
shoe Chamber of Comm­
erce and Agriculture, and 
will be coordinated by 
Llano Estacado Civic Club.

Also, all day, at the 
Bailey County Exhibition 
Center and Coliseum, the 
Moonlight Home Exten­
sion Club will be sponsor­
ing a handcrafted bazaar. 
They suggest this will be a 
good time to shop around 
for Christmas items during 
the day.

There will be no admis­
sion charge for the bazaar,  
where over 50 booths will 
be open during the day. 
Also, a concession stand 
will be open at the coli­
seum.

For the parade,  this year, 
three school bands will be 
featured.  Both the Mule­
shoe High School and 
Muleshoe Junior High Sc­
hool band will be in the 
parade,  as will the Laz- 
buddie High School band.

Also included in the pa ­
rade this year will be 
several floats, antique

cars, marching groups, 
and at least one riding 
club. And, of course, Santa 
Claus will make his official 
visit to Muleshoe and will 
be riding in the parade.

The parade will get  un ­

turn west for one block 
then back to the south to 
the Boy Scout grounds.

The annual parade is 
termed this year “ An Old 
Fashioned Chr is tmas”  and 
will officially kick off the

derway at the Boy Scout 4*1 oliday season in this area.

LD STAR WINNERS HONORED—Jimmy Gleason, left and Delia Shaw are 
wn with their Gold Star awards which are the highest  awards presented by a 
nty 4-H. They were honored in Lubbock last Monday night.  Jimmy is the son of 
and M rs. Jerry Gleason and Delia is the daughter  of Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Shaw.

Grounds on South Main 
Street and will travel north 
to Avenue B where it will

Farmers 
Invited 
To Meet

Farmers and ranchers in 
Bailey County are invited 
to take part  in a meeting 
with Secretary of Agricul­
ture Bob Bergland on the 
“ structure of agriculture.”
The meeting will be Dec. 

6 in Wichita Falls and is 
one of 10 regional meet­
ings designed to obtain 
comments and suggestions 
on the economic and social 
issues affecting the st ruc­
ture of American agricul­
ture and rural life. Major 
purpose will be to deter­
mine the overall impact of 
all the different problems, 
policies and conditions 
that interact to influence 
farm structure,  points out 
Spencer Tanksley, county 
agent with the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service, 
Texas A&M University Sy­
stem.

More details on how to 
submit the request  are 
available at the local co­
unty Extension and ASCS 
offices. Written comments 
may also be submitted to 
be included in a final 
document  to be published 
following the series of 
meetings.

According to Tanksley, 
the meeting will provide 
for a re-examination of the 
structure of American ag­
riculture so that a compre­
hensive package of factual 
information and recomm- 
ondations can be devel­
oped for use in proposing 
future policies, especially 
new farm legislation for 
1981.
This meeting provides an 

opportunity for everyone 
interested in the future of 
agriculture * to make his 
voice heard,  points out the 
county agent.

Muleshoe Mules 
VS.

Childress Bobcats 
Friday-7:30 p.m.

Buffalo Bowl 
Canyon

Several merchants will 
probably be featuring spe ­
cial Christmas buys, along 
with the bazaar.

Featured in the bazaar,  
which is the first annual 
bazaar to be conducted by 
the Moonlight Home Ex­
tension Club will be booths 
from Muleshoe,  Hereford, 
Dimmitt,  Lubbock, Plain- 
view, Clovis, Sudan, Tucu- 
mcari, N.M.  and Amarillo, 
along with other locations.

Mark Lam of Plainview 
con’t on page 6 col 1

Minor Injury 

From Accident 

North Of Town
Shortly after 6:30 p.m. 

Thursday,  officers and an 
ambulance were notified 
that an accident had occur­
red north of Muleshoe on 
Highway 214.
Taken to West Plains 

Medical Center for em er ­
gency t rea tment  was Jo 
Wood, who was the driver 
of a late model car that 
struck the back of two 
cotton trailers being towed 
on the highway by Consep- 
cion Rejino of Muleshoe.

Mrs. Wood received no 
broken bones, but was 
hospitalized overnight for 
observation. She received 
chin lacerations and contu­
sions to her chest and right 
hand.

Traffic was routed thro­
ugh ditches until the cot­
ton and trailer debris could 
be removed from the high­
way. One cotton trailers 
was completely destroyed, 
as was Mrs. Wood’s vehi­
cle.

Investigating the accident 
was Department  of Public 
Safety Trooper Jim Dulin. 
Assisting with rerouting 
traffic until the highway 
could be cleared were Dep­
uty Sheriff Monte Phipps 
and City Patrolman Ray 
Lynk, who had been asked 
to help re-route the heavy 
traffic.

Cotton Prospect 
Brighter Now 
On South Plains
Sixteen counties on the 

southern high plains will 
harvest around 2.6 million 
bales of cotton this year, 
nearly half of the s tate’s 
projected 5.7 million bales 
and a regional increase of 
more than one million over 
last year’s harvest.

Bailey, Lamb, Cochran, 
Hockley, Lubbock, Crosby, 
Yoakum, Terry, Lynn, Ga­
ines, Dawson, Andrews, 
Martin,  Howard, Midland 
and Glasscock counties are 
expected to produce 1,125, 
000 more bales of cotton 
than they did last year, 
giving the state its biggest  
harvest  in 30 years.

County yields should ave­
rage 404 pounds per acre, 
up from 259 last year. 
More than 3 million acres 
are anticipated for harvest.

According to Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown, the Texas Crop 
and Livestock Reporting 
Service sees this year’s 
crop as 50 percent higher 
than last year 's  and four 
percent above 1977's. If 
figures are realized, the 
1979 crop will be the 
largest since the 1949 pro­
duction of 6.04 million 
bales.

The Nov. 1 forecast is up
100.000 bales or 2 percent 
from the previous month. 
Harvested acreage, esti­
mated at 6.9 million, is 
unchanged. Yield is ex­
pected to average 397 
pounds of lint per harves­
ted acre, compared with 
294 for 1978 and 407 for 
1977. -
Cotton quality has been 

good except for early ginn- 
ings on the High Plains 
which have reflected low 
micronaire readings. Stat­
ewide harvest was 36 per­
cent complete by early 
November.

American-Pima cotton 
production is estimated at
32.000 bales, up 20 per­
cent from last year but 
down 1,000 bales or three 
percent from last month.

Second Half Rally 
Saves Playoff Hope
An early Christmas pre­

sent was acquired by the 
Muleshoe Mules, the 
Muleshoe High School co­
aching staff and the entire 
community Friday after­
noon, after the Mules set­
tled down to serious busi­
ness and won their second 
consecutive Bi-District ti­
tle at Plainview.

It was beautiful football 
weather when Mule fans 
traveled to Plainview for 
the 2 p.m. game, accompa­
nied by periodic signs 
taped to highway signs 
noting that “ Mule Mania 
is Passing By;”  “ Mule 
Mania is the Most” and 
other similar signs all the 
way to Plainview.

During the first half of 
the 27-13 game, it was 
questionable as to the out ­
come, but the ‘Kardiac 
Kids’ settled down in the 
second half, and following 
the third quarter of the 
game, there could be no 
question as to the out­
come.

Idalou went on the score- 
board first when Idalou 
quarterback Brad DeBusk 
sneaked through from the 
one after nine plays and 3b 
yards to put six points up 
with 6:01 showing on the 
scoreboard clock. Alan 
Emery made it a 7-0 ball- 
game.

Miscues by the Mules, 
who had a little trouble 
getting going handed the 
ball to the Wildcats for 
most of the first half, but 
the Mule defense started 
toughening up and held 
the 'Cats on their five yard 
line preventing an addi­
tional score at 7:45 of the 
second. Although the 
Mules took over on downs, 
they missed a crucial third 
and long, turning the ball 
back over to the Wildcats 
who managed a 12 yard 
pass play on third and 
long. ‘Cat quarterback De- 
Busk had been sacked for a 
loss then DeBusk found 
Dennis Green for the 12 
yards and a Wildcat touch­
down at 3:17 of the second 
quarter.  Emerys’ extra 
point at tempt  had failed 
and the Mules watched a

hope for a halftime lead 
fail when Idalou intercep­
ted a Mule quarterback 
Mike Northcutt pass on 
their own seven with just 
40 seconds to halftime.

But, the Mules d idn’t go 
into the lockerroom at half­
time scoreless as Zeke 
Pecina had scored on a 
four yard scamper at 11:09 
of the second on a fourth 
down play. Sam Whalin’s 
kick for the extra point was 
good.

At halftime, the score 
was 7-13, and although 
M ule fans were just a little 
uneasy,  they certainly still 
had high hopes, as the 
Mules had come through 
too many times from be­
hind.

Then came the third qua­
rter. which was picture- 
perfect for the Mules. 
Dismayed Wildcats and 
their fans across the field 
watched the Mules move 
the ball almost at will, and 
it was a Zeke Pecina Show 
as he gained yardage be ­
fore he racked up an 
astounding 194 yards in 
his 24 carries.

An amazed Charles Wal­
ker found just a large 
enough hole to get through 
from the 10, and slammed 
into the end zone for a 
score at 7:55 of the third 
and Whalin made it a 
14-13 game.

As the Wildcats watched 
their lead fade, the dispir­
ited ‘Cats’ failed to come 
up with the big plays, and 
a desperation fourth down 
gamble failed in a surge of 
black clad Mules, who 
carried the ball player 
backward giving the Mules 
the ball on their own 40.

On the first play from 
scrimmage following the 
failed fourth down play, 
Zeke Pecina hugged the 
right side line all the way 
downfield as he raced to a 
40 yard touchdown virtu­
ally untouched. He had 
good blocking from the 
Mule defense and went in 
standing up with 5:51 on 
the clock. Whalin’s kick 
failed, but the Mules were 
leading at this point 20-13.

con' t  on pge 6 col 1 ■

PLAYING KEEP AW AY —It was the Zeke Pecina 
Show’ Friday afternoon when the Muleshoe Mules 
successfully defended their bi-district title from 1978 
and again walked off with the title, being Bi-District 
Cham pions for 1979.
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Enochs News
By

Mrs. J.I)L Bavl

Mrs. W.R. Adams was in 
Morton Wednesday and 
visited in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. J .H.  Machen.

• *  • * •

Rossilyn Shields, of Lub­
bock, visited her grand­
mother,  Mrs. Lorello 
Jones and Uncle Wendell 
last Sunday.

• • • * •
We wish to welcome Rev. 

Mike Heady and wife, 
Connie, and son, Travis, 
from Aledo to Enochs. 
They spent last Tuesday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. 
W.B. Peterson, Rev. He­
ady is the new pastor of 
the Enochs Baptist Church 
They moved into the par­
sonage Wednesday.  The 
church had their Thanks­
giving dinner at the fellow- 
shoe hall of the Church 
Sunday Nov. 18, following 
the morning service. 

* * * * *

Visitors at the Baptist 
Church were Mrs. H.H. 
Snow of Muleshoe, JaLisa 
Price of Morton, Mr. and 
Mrs.  Harold Layton and 
Robert, Mrs. Jerry Nichols 
and Kristen of Dell City, 
Mrs. Alberta Bryant of 
Littlefield, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Waltrip.

Rev. Marvin Gregory of 
Morton brought the m es s ­
age at the Methosist C h­
urch Sunday and they had 
dinner at the church.

1979
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 

Lewis and children of 
Earth spent Saturday with 
her parents,  Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Pollard.

* * * * *
Mrs. Margie Vance of 

Houston who is working 
for Delta Air Lines drop­
ped her sister, Mrs. W.L. 
Welch a card. She was in 
Amsterdam.

* * * * *
Willie Welch, was a pati­

ent in the Littlefield Medi­
cal Center,  Tuesday till 
Saturday.

West Plains 
Medical Center! 

Report

Mrs. Don Vanlanding- 
ham and Mrs. Robert Ge­
orge of Lubbock, Mrs. 
Doyle Windfield of Little­
field. Mrs. E.N. McCall of 
Enochs and Mrs. Fred 
Locker of Bula attended 
the funeral service of Mer ­
ton Kelly, a nephew of 
Mrs. Locker and Mrs. 
McCall. 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day at the Lemons Memo­
rial Chapel in Plainview. 
Rev. Carlos McLeod pastor 
of the First Baptist Church 
in Plainview officiated.

Mrs. Alberta Bryant, of 
Littlefield, visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Bayless, Sunday afterno­
on.

ADMITTED
Nov. 19-Alpha Neely, 

Dwain Shackleford, Eude- 
lia Villareal.

Nov. 20--W.E. Lackey, 
Sarah Graham,  Ada Mur- 
rah, H.F.  Vandiver, John­
ny Morales,  Jerry Redwine 

Nov. 21-Minnie Ellis, Jo ­
di Ketcherside,  Ed Stein- 
bock, Veronica Dale Fu- 
ente, Russell Duncan. Zela

Furr.
Nov. 22-Saundra Pool, 

Ima Deaz, Dorothy Tilles, 
Lee Roy Cole, Paula 
Burns,  Josephine Wood, 
Linda Pend, Selma Bur- 
man.

Nov. 23-Beth Mengrno- 
ris, Maggie Patterson,  
M arie Darnell.

DISMISSED
Nov. 19-Lucille Scheller, 

Bernandean Kieler, Patri­

cia Rodreguez.
Nov. 20-Lucille Bransc- 

om, Pat Young, Ynes Ale­
man, Frances Perez, Eud- 
elia Vellarreal, Rosa Maria 
Rey and baby boy, Abun- 
dio Arguellez, Lee Roy 
Cole.

Nov. 21 -Ralph E. Et- 
ridge. Frances King, Sena 
Bukrman, Russel Duncan, 
Tom Hudson, Thurmon 
Bartlett,  Zela Furr,  Me-

Shane Davis, Doris Ash­
ford, Marie Darnell.

Nov. 22-Dwain Shackle­
ford, Henry Vandiver, Ada 
Murrah,  Jerry Redwine, 
Jodi Ketcherside,  Johnny 
M ardcs.

Essential Knowledge
The wife- What do you 

know about women's
clothes?

Husband (bitterly)--The 
price.

rThe Lonely Heart

'|WAS HOLDING MY WALLET INONE 
HAND AND THIS LETTER IN THE 
OTHER AND-------- " ftfs, |

Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Petree, drove to Clovis, 
N.M. Sunday afternoon to 
visit their son, Kenneth 
Petree and family.

Help cure 
cancer 

write now*

Harold Layton of Dell 
City has been staying with 
his parents,  Mr. and Mrs. 
J .W.  Layton and helping 
harvest the cotton, his 
wife. Loretta and son Rob­
ert came for the weekend 
and he helped in the grain 
harvest. Other guests Sun­
day afternoon were her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. H.H. 
Snow of Muleshoe and 
Mrs. Jerry Nichols and 
Kristen of Dell City.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Price 

received word Saturday 
that their daughter Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale Wheeler 
who has been in Dahran 
Saudi Arabia the last 7 
years will leave there Dec. 
16th and live in Houston a 
year.

• * * • •

Mrs. W.L. Welch has a 
call from her sister, Mrs. 
Linda Hinchberger from 
Japan Sunday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Key 
visited his brother,  W.L. 
Key at Oklahoma Lane 
Sunday and Monday who 
had a heart attack Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Coff­
man and Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D. Bayless received 
word last week that their 
brother-in-law George He­
nderson, of Azel was in the 
hospital seriously ill.

Mr. and Mrs. Kile Gob­
ble and Michelle of Hobbs, 
N.M. spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Welch. Mr. and Mrs. Wil­
lie Welch also visited with 
t h em .

n<r

Thanks to your help, 
the tide is beginning to 
turn.

The past few years have 
brought new discoveries in 
chemotherapy.

And new diagnostic 
techniques that combine 
the “eyes” of X-ray 
machines with the 
“brains" of computers.
And successful new 
programs of combination 
therapies.

And there are 
promising reports coming 
in from research 
laboratories all over the 
world.

We now have 
everything we need to save 
about half the people who 
get cancer.

Please don’t quit on us 
now.

American 
Cancer Society f.

We want to cure cancer in your lifetime

Solve water 
problems by 

renting a

LINDSAY

Cedi us for rental information 
today. Only $ | |  .50

a month.

LINDSAY

Wilson
Drilling

Co.
W. Hwy. 84  

272-5521

TH ERE fS  NO FER TILIZER  SH O R TA G E!
While the principal business of our feedlot is the production 

of beef for a hungry world, there are certain byproducts of 
our operations which are available to help in the opera­
tions of other segments of agriculture. One such product 
is nutrient-rich manure, offering unique fertilization 
potential.

Through tests conducted at the U S.D A South­
western Great Plains Research Center at Bushland,
Texas, we have learned specific facts relating to the 
use of our solid wastes as fertilizer. For example, 
application of only ten tons of solid waste 
material to an acre of moderately irrigated 
crop lands has been s u ff ic ie n t to  ob ta in  
maximum yields. There is a residual effect 
available through manure fertilization: the 
process of decomposition continues to pro­
vide nutrients, at a reduced level, through the second and even third 
years after application! C '-  f '

There are definite economic advantages to the crop producer \  “ 
using the manure fertilization system. Initial cost, of course, and also^*1* 
the economies of the methods of application. No special equipment is 
required: the material is deep plowed into the field and application can 
be made at the time of working fields prior to planting (the farther in 
advance of planting the better). Thus, fertilization occurs as a course of 
normal operation, with standard plowing equipment, resulting in fewer 
man hours required and. particularly important in light of the energy crisis, 
less fuel consumption.

The table below lists the nutrient content of manure sampled from 23 
feedlots on the Texas High Plains, giving the range, average percentages 
and average pounds of nutrients present in ten tons.

RANGE A VERAG E AMT. IN 10 TONS

% % lb

Nitrogen 1.16 — 1.96 1.34 268
Phosphorus (P2O5) .73 — 1 95 1.21 243
Potassium (K2O) 9 0 - 2.83 2.17 362
Sodium . 2 9 - 1.43 74 148
Calcium 81 - 1.75 1.30 260
Magnesium . 3 2 - 66 .50 100
Iron 09 - 55 .21 42
Zinc 005 - -  .012 .009 1.8
Water 20.9 —  54.5 34 5 6,900

H ERE ARE SAM PLE Y IELD S IN POUNDS PER A C RE :
Grain Sorghum Yield in Lbs/A

Fertilizer
No Manure Manure 240 lbs. N/A

Treatment 10T/ A 30T/A 100 lbs. N/A

4-yr. average 4735 Ibs/A 6366 lbs./A 6232 lbs./A 6156 lbs./A

Corn Silage Yield in Tons/A (70% water)

No Manure Manure Fertilizer
Treatment 10T/ A 20T/A 200 lbs. N/A

3-yr. average 19 9 T/A 21.7T/A 22.7 T/A 21.0T/A

THERE CAN BE A DEFINITE ADVANTAGE TO YOU 
THROUGH FARMING WITH MANURE FERTILIZATION. PLEASE 
TALK TO US. WE'LL BE GLAD TO HELP YOU FIGURE THE 
ECONOMICS AS THEY APPLY TO YOUR OWN OPERATION I

King Feed Lot
Ph. 272-4410 or 272 -4541

Muleshoe, Texas
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You Save an EXTRA 13$ on 15$ off label

Joy
Detergent

12-oz.
btl.

Prices Good Thru Sat. Dec. 1,1979 
Each of theee advertised items is required to be readily available for aale at or below the advertiaed price in each 
store, except as specifically noted in this ad. We reserve the right to limit quantities. None told to dealers.

You Save 17e on

Bounty 
Towels
You Save 22t on Duncan Hinej

Cake 
Mixes
Nabisco

Ritz
Crackers
Nabisco Cookiea

Chips 
Ahoy
All Coffee Grinds

Maxwell 
House
Welch's Grape Jam or

Grape
Jelly ,2,“

ievi-oz.
pkg

16-oz,
pkg.!

19-oz.
pkg.

1-lb.
can

59*
69*
89*
$ 1 3 9

$099

$ 1 0 9

You Save 13$ on Asa’t Mexican Varieties

Patio Dinners
11 V« to 12%-oz. pkg.

6 5 <
You Save 30$ on Kraft

Velveeta
2-lb. pkg.2«a

Russet Baking Large Size, New Crop

Potatoes
1 0  lb. bag

3°

88 8
All Purpose, Yellow, Med/Lg.

Onions 6  $ 1

Northwest, Sweet 4 Juicy Excellent Party Mixers

Anjou
P e a r s

Jalapenos * 5 8 °  3 S1
Hot Peppers, Full of Flavor

excellent party Mixers

Tangy L im e s .» 4 8 c
Mustard or Collard lev Crisp

G reens 3  — . . s 1



Fifth Grade Requesting 
Christmas Lighting Here

presents.
Sincerely,
Carlos Rosas
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShr.zo School

Recently, with an annou­
ncement  that Christmas 
lights may not be installed 
on the city streets in 
Muleshoe, members of a 
fifth grade class started 
their own collection to help 
repair and furnish light 
bulbs for the existing 
Christmas decorations.

A number of the students 
wrote the following letters 
to Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce and Agricul­
ture Manager John Gulley:

Dear Sir,
1 like decorations because 

they're beautiful and they 
bring out the Christmas 
spirit in everyone. That is 
why, 1 like Christmas dec­
orations.
Sincerely,
Todd Bessire 
5th Grade
Mary DeShazo School

Dear Sir,
I want Christmas decora­

tions because I think they 
look pretty. 1 think other 
people think they are pre t ­
ty too. It makes our town 
look pretty. It makes our 
town look more special, 
especially at Christmas.  
Yours truly 
Pam W illiams 
Fifth Grade 
Mary DeShazo School 

* • • • •
Dear Mr. Gulley,

1 would like Christmas 
decorations for Christmas,  
because I think it would be 
good for all the people of 
Muleshoe to have them.  
We are collecting money 
for Christmas decorations 
because we think Mule­
shoe will look better with 
Christmas decorations.

Yours truly,
Henry Hurtado
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School.

* * • • *
Dear Mr. Gully,

1 like the bright colors. If 
it wasn’t for the bright 
lights and colors our town 
would not look pretty. On 
Christmas we celebrate 
Jesus  birthday, so I think 
we ought to have lights 
and decorations. I would 
like light and decorations 
on Christmas.
Sincerely,
Alan Horn
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School

Dear Sir,
We would like to have 

decorations at Christmas 
time. We will like Chris­
tmas trees and bells and

Muleshoe Home 
Center Inc.

105 East Ave B 
Formerly

G & G Floor Covering 
Want To Invite All 

Their Friends & Customers 
To Stop By & Visit At
Their New Location.

Sherri Shipman & Bob Gage 
Will Show You How To Spruce Up 

Your Home For The Winter Months.

Dear Sir,
I want Christmas decor­

ations this Christmas be­
cause it is when Jesus was 
born. It looks very pretty in 
Muleshoe and I like it and 
our family likes it too. We 
want Christmas decoration 
this year.
Yours Truly,
Alex Telles 
Fifth Grade 
Mary DeShazo School

Dear Sir,
1 would like lights for 

Christmas because if it 
were not for the lights the 
town would not be pretty. 1 
would like lights for Chris­
tmas so the town would 
look pretty.

W e would have lots of fun 
with all the lights on the 
street  houses and stores. 
Sincerely,
Armando Ontiveroz
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School

Dear Sir,
I like decorations because 

some of the people like 
decorations on Christmas 
because it makes the town 
look pretty on Christmas 
night. Other people likes 
them too. I would like to 
see them on peoples hou­
ses on Christmas night. I 
think 1 would like to see 
them on Christmas night. 
Yours truly,
Donna Flowers
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School

• • * * *
Dear Mr. Gulley,

I want to have decora­
tions because they look 
real pretty and when you 
go to town you can see the 
lights. The people’s
houses look real pretty and 
the Christmas trees looks 
real pretty too.

Yours truly,
Angelita Quintanilla
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School

Dear Mr. Gulley, 
Decorations are part of 

Christmas.  They show ha­
ppiness on Christmas and 
get people in the spirit of 
Christmas.

I believe we deserve to 
have Christmas lights, for 
all the work people do for 
Christm as.

Another reason why is 
because Christ our Lord 
was born on Christmas 
day. I think he deserves 
much more than we can 
give him, but I think it 
would make him happy to 
see us celebrate his bi rth­
day with such spirit. 
Sincerely,
Leah Bell
Fifth Grade
Mary DeShazo School

Fine arts courses 
open to non-majors

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.) -  Is 
that an engineering student 
taking a course in watercolor 
painting?

It could be if it’s at The 
University of Texas, for die 
College of Fine Arts is open­
ing more of its art, drama and 
music courses to non-majors.

The intent of the new effort, 
according to Associate Dean 
Bill Francis, "is not to mold 
professionals—but to develop 
tastes, increase understand­
ing through participation and 
build a base for leisure-time 
activities.”

Dean Oscar Brockett, who 
has encouraged the move, 
feels "something is missing” 
from the lives of college- 
educated persons who have no 
familiarity with the arts

Lazbuddie
News

Marsha Collum

Visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Collum 
recently was Col lum’s mo­
ther, Mrs. Helen Collum, 
of Colorado Springs, Colo.

Several Lazbuddie area 
residents,  are bowling on a 
league each Tuesday ni­
ght. They are called the 
Lazbuddie Mixed League. 
Several of the couples are, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dave Engel- 
king, Mr. and Mrs.  Donnie 
McDonald, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Engelking, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don McDonald.

Also, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Jennings,  Mr. and Mrs. 
Phil Brockman, Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Jesdo,  Mr. and 
Mrs. Melvin Morris, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Robin­
son, Mr. and Mrs. Auron 
Drager,  Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Kimbrough, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Groom, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wade Cargile, Mr. and 
Mrs.Lyndon Foster, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gene Stacker,  
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Jesko 
and Mr. and Mrs. Doyle 
Weir.

Marilyn Hinkson and 
Donna Smith are hosting a 
Community Christmas gift 
Bazzar, Wednesday,  Nov. 
28, from 2-4 p.m. in the 
home of Mrs. Frank (Mari­
lyn Hinkson), five miles 
north of Lazbuddie. Those 
busy making gifts are, 
Hester Barnes, Ronald Ell­
iott, Donna Smith, Marilyn

THE LONELY HEART j

(J
Cfjurcf) of

(Cljrlst
I6rb anb Slbrnur 3D

I SERVING CHRIST AND 
OUR FELLOW MAN

Sunday 10:30 am 
6:00 pm

GIBSON’S

Store Hours: 
Mon-Sat. 9-7 

Sun. 1-6 f k\ ■ *£IT
Prices

\ \  ia \ |
, Lite-B rite

Effective 
Nov. 25-28

ucture*.\- ; picUH

lugW bum requilred’

Discount cenTER Wranglers
Sky Blue' Brown'Checks

So-Soft 
Face 

& Hand 
Lotion

m

Musical Jolly 
Chimp

$10"
45 Piece

Ironstone
Set

Service for 8

*28“

Snow Jet

Snow Flocking

i t

Hi- Dri 
Paper Towels |

Men's Long Sleeve

Western
Shirts

Christmas

Wreaths

Vicks Vapo Steam

c

Wallcork
Squares

in
bucks.
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Hinkson. Debbie Parker, »n returning with two 
Marsha Collum and ot ­
hers. *Everyone is invited to do 
their Christmas shopping 
in Lazbuddie.

Mr. and Mrs. Darrell 
Mason, spent several days 
in Las Vegas, Nevada last 
week on vacation.

Bill Morris and Jim Col­
lum, went deer hunting in 
the foot hills of New Mex­
ico, near Roswell, last 
week. Both were delighted

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Mou- 
dy, Gabe and Robin of 
Canyon, recently visited 
several days with her pa r­
ents,  Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Mimms.

Mrs.  Dixie Barnes,  is a 
medical patient in the Par­
mer County Hospital,  in 
Friona. She is feeling bet ­
ter.

Church recommends panel 
delay treaty to Senate.

f l w

'U ia n u fc H
In New Orleans

the BEST V A LU E for Quiet Luxury 
at most moderate rates

e g a n c e Plus
private dressing rooms, walk-in closets 
and two telephones in all rooms and 
suites; free valet parking

Great location; 2 blocks to the 
Superdome, 1 block to Medical Center, 
3 blocks to Central Business District,
6 blocks to French Quarter and the 
Civic Center and Oil Center are right 
across the street

fabulous New Orleans cuisine and 
Continental dishes

flitTuaruiicft
H O TEL

1315 Gravier Street 
New Orleans La 70112 
(5041586 0100 
Toll Free 
1 800 535 9141

MAIL COUPON FOR BROCHURES AND ^  
SPECIAL PACKAGE INFORMATION. *

NAME_ 

ADDRESS- 

CITY_ 

STATE, ZIP™ J

V-

U

Christmas 
Tree Stands

Colonial Kitchen Govrmet

Chopping
Block S ’

LH

Soundesign

Pocket Radio

$ 1 0 0 0

No. 2413

30 DAYS 
L E F T  'T il  

CHRISTMAS

Ladies

Pull-on Poly- 
Gabardine Slacks

Little Girls

Fashion Jeans

30%OFF

V ib M  From V  Thru * r

EVERY DAY 
LOW PRICES

Gal. Homo Milk............... * 2 *
1/2 Gal. Homo Milk.........96*
Gal. Lowfat Milk............ * 1 "
1/2 Gal. Lowfat................ 94*
1/2 Gal. Buttermilk........ .98*
2 Lb. Cottage Cheese....
1 Lb. Cottage Cheese......91*
Sour Cream........................49*

Cream..............58*
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W IF E

WIFE,  Women Involved 
in Farm Economics, held 
their third annual National 
Convention November 16- 
18 at the Civic Center in 
Lubbock.

“ W 1FE has been spectac­
ularly successful,”  said 
Dr. Frances Hill, professor 
at the University of Texas.

WIFE is the only national 
farm organization with an 
energy program. You have 
done something great.  You 
are up as a general farm 
organization and are going 
after the big issues. She

advised the agricultural 
association not to lose 
sight of their two main 
issues--saving the family 
farm and the farm-focused 
energy program.

Mrs. Sarah Weddington,  
Assistant to the President 
on W om en’s Issues and 
National Political Issues, 
brought greetings from the 
President.  “ They are list­
ening to you in Washing­
ton” Mrs.  Weddington 
said. She told members,  
what the administration 
was doing to improve the 
status of women. WIFE, 
will be involved in White 
House briefings in the 
future,  Mrs.  Weddington 
said.

Speaking to over 500 
people at the banquet  was 
Mrs.  Sarah McClendon.

White House Correspon­
dent and internationally 
famous journalist.

Besides giving a first 
hand look at the White 
House and Congress she 
discussed WIFE. “ WIFE 
is a great  inspiration” said 
Mrs. McClendon.

“ You do your homework 
and get to the bottom of 
problems.”  She also gave 
WIFE much of the credit 
for alerting Washington,  
D.C. to the farm problems.

Mr. Soleta refutes the 
argument  that gasohol will 
take food away from 
people. “ Alcohol plants

will extract excess carbo­
hydrates out of cereal 
crops and then concentrate 
the nutrition. This will 
eliminate 2/3 of the shipp­
ing cost and still Provide 
nutrition at better quality 
and quant i ty .”

Dr. Lance Crombie, a 
pioneer in the field of 
alcohol fuels, gave m em ­
bers and their husbands  
plans of various alcohol 
stills and discussed diffe­
rent distillation processes.  
He also encouraged every­
one to apply for a permit to 
operate an alcohol still.

ENGAGEMENT AN NOU NCED ...M r. and Mrs. J .W.  
Herington, of the West Camp Community, announce 
the engagement  and approaching December marriage 
of their daughter,  Karan Kay to Darrell Gene Newsom, 
son of Mrs. Faye Newson of Brownfield and Gene 
Newsom of Lubbock. The bride elect is a graduate of 
Farwell High School, South Plains College and will be a 
December graduate of Texas Tech University. The 
prospective bridegroom is a graduate of Brownfield 
High School, attended Abilene Christian University 
and will be a December graduate of Texas Tech 
U niversity.

Grand Cross Of Color
Mr. and Mrs. Alton Ept- 
ing, Mrs. Pam Miller, 
Mrs. Eulaine Phillips, 
Mess Marcia Rudd, Mrs. 
Ruth Williams, Mrs. Gayla 
Wagnon, Mrs. Latrelle 
Hysinger, Mrs. Nelda 
Hunt,  Miss Kanetha Hys­
inger, Miss Shelia Hunt, 
and Mrs. Mary Farley.

HOWHKH 
IS YOUR

E.Q.?
(Economics Quobenl)

CAN YOU ANSWER BASIC ECONOMIC QUESTIONS LIKE THESE?
True False
□  □  (l.)Oneoutof 
five American workers belongs 
to a labor union.
D □  (2.) Producers of 
goods outnumber producers 
of services in our economy.
□  □  (3.) U.S. coal 
reserves are the world's largest.

□  (4.) Inflation 
reduces the standard of 
living of people on relatively 
fixed incomes.

If you found these 
questions tough, your 
Economics Quotient, your 
E.Q., could probably stand

The Grand Cross of Color 
observance, was held,
Monday evening, Nov. 19, 
at the Corral Restaurant.

Dinner was served at 7 
p.m. The invocation was 
given by Ernest Kerr. The 
meeting was called to or­
der by the president,  Mrs.
Ruby Lee Kerr. Minutes of 
the previous meeting were 
read and approved.

The annual election of 
officers resulted in the 
following members being 
elected by acclamation: 
president,  Mrs. Pam Mil­
ler, vice president,  Mrs.
Latrelle Hysinger,  secre­
tary, Mrs. Mary Finley,
(re-elected) decorations 
chairman, appointed by 
the new president,  Mrs.
Louise Williams.

The tables were in the 
form of a cross, and were 
decorated with a large, 
white cross, rainbow bible 
and rainbow colored r ib­
bons. The bread service 
was read by the president,  
and the assistants were,
Shelia Hunt and Kanetha 
Hysinger.

The date, time and place 
of meeting for the 1980 
observance will be annou­
nced by the president.

The Grand Cross of Color some improvement.
A special booklet has 

been prepared to help you 
learn more about what

and service in the Order of makes our American

is an Honorary Degree 
presented for participation

, „ . . ,  . , Economic System tick. It's
the Rainbow for girls. fact-filled, easy reading and

In closing, the Benedic- free. It's also an easy way to 
tion was given, “ May the raiseyourE.Q.
, . . . . For your copy, write:
Lord watch over me and 'Economics/Pueblo.
thee while we are absent Colorado81009.
one from the other. May ANSWERS: I F  1 C d'2IT 
you depart in peace and 
the peace of God go with 
you always.”

Attending were: Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Kerr, Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne Williams,

The American 
Economic System.
W» should all loam ma* about it. 

tSnd 'SV l US D*x* t* i  Ol C o m * ,.

to J k  Q t t d d  
film men vkfono/iing

£ K a / ie n  ^ e / t in g t o h
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T>n Ounf/ntj. (k  Seoosd, ^Alinrtern

owl Swathj-uMine. tTw)W 7}bw  to 
<rTouA<DTi(At|j Oofoofr ih tk oÂ tfJwoon.

MR. & MRS. PRESTON MARTIN 
MR. & MRS. GEORGE WHEELER 
MR. & MRS. ERNEST RAMM 
MR. & MRS. ROBERT HUNT 
MR. & MRS. WELDON TIMS 
MR. & MRS. DALTON HARRIS 
MR. & MRS. BOYD LANDERS 
MR. & MRS. A . J .  LENDERSON 
MR. & MRS. BUDDY FOSTER 
MR. & MRS. C .E .  GRANT

MEMORIES.. .Mr.  and Mrs. L.F. McCormick, long 
time residents of Muleshoe, will celebrate their 50th 
wedding anniversary, Sunday, December 2, 1979 in the 
Bailey County Exhibition Center and Coliseum, from 2 
to 4 p.m.  The reception will be hosted by their children 
and families. They were married December 6, 1929, in 
Eden, Texas.

s
American Heart Association

fray frry fcyfrn .  j ry-l irv-Er^

CASH
LAY-A-WAY

LADIES & JUNIOR 
FASHIONS

Junior

GIRLS $  
FASHION

Save up
BLOUSES to 5.oo

15VELOUR $
TOPS Sizes 3 to 13

FAYS CLOSET
RALPHS ORIGINALS 

COORDIANTES

97

GIRLS 3 pc 
COORDINATE

SUITS 2 9 97
Values to 2 to 6x 

36.50 1 9 9 7

33%1 °f>s / v  OFF
Regular 14.00 to 36.00

GIRLS WARM
SLEEPWEAR
Values 
to 13.00

7 9 7
• ea.

ENTIRE STOCK 
FALL 79  
JUNIOR

\  aW,e* 
to 1»°° 0 9 7

y  ea.
DRESSES

LAYAWAY
NOW
FOR

CHRISTMAS

20% OFF

GIRLS TOPS 
3 9 7Values to 

15.00

i '

JUNIOR TOPS 
& PANTS 3 97

SWEATERS
t o p s  v« i r
PANTS 26.00 L

Ea.

Ea.

MEN & YOUNG MENS FASHIONS
\ DRESS OR SPORT
1 C U I D T C

$ g 9 7

A GIFT THAT IS 
SURE TO 

PLEASE

• ^ / V T H L E T I C  

FOOTWEAR

SHIRTS
Values to -16.00

SPECIAL PURCHASE YOUNG MENS
'  TERRY ,oWp»re 

SHIRTS a .* 00
MENS CORDUROY OR TWILL

4 POCKET

» f

BOYS 4 POCKET 
WRANGLER

JEANS
6 to 16 0 9 7
Reg. 12.00 O

(STUDENT 
WRANGLER

V'i JEANS $
Compare at 16.00

SPECIAL GROUP 
MENS 3 & 4  PIECE

JEANS
9 7  Reg. 14.00 1 0 ”

C-: if? [VESTED v“h,e"
SUITS 145°00

GROUP II Values 
to 155.00

6997
9 9 ”

BOYS
SHIRTS
Values 2 for 
to 9.00 *5

c v * '.

HEADQUARTERS
CUSTOMIZED

SOFT LUGGAGE!
• 4 42 POCKET 

HANG BAG

ROOT BAG 1 4
16JAM BAG

LET US ORDER 
NOW & CUSTOMIZE
NOW BN STOCK 

BROWN, CAMEL OR TAN SUIT BAG
BO O !
BAG 14  JAM BAG *16

LADIES OR MENS

JOG SUITS
Values to 38.00

2 PIECE

$ J Q 9 7

FOOTWEAR FASHIONS
Zodiac

Old ENTIRE STOCK FASHION BOOTS
Maine 

T rotters

t

REGULAR NOW

85.00  $5695
80.00 •S S 60

6 8 . 0 0  $4 5 * 6

GIRLS FASHION BOOTS
REGULAR *25 NOW *20

33%
OFF 1 r

•30 •24
*28

2 0 %
off

SPECIAL GROUP FALL 79
FASHION HEELS

S h o e . & S tu ff V a lu e “
Old Main Trotters

FAMOLARE SHOES Reg. 44.oo

MENS FASHION
DRESS OR 
CASUAL 
SHOES
Values to 44.00

$ 1 9 9 7

St Gbfo t
brk in  V \  l a  in  •



B u la  News
By

Norma Bellar

Mr. and Mrs. P.R. Pierce 
and family, gathered to­
gether Sunday, at their 
daughters home in Lub­
bock, Mr. and Mrs.  John­
ny Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Carpenter and sons 
Joey and Jeremy of Mule- 
shoe also attended to have 
their Thanksgiving Din­
ner.

Mr. and Mrs. P.R. Pierce 
visited her sister Mr. and 
Mrs.  Erwin Nieman in 
Muleshoe,  Monday.

GOLDEN ANNIVERSARY...Mr. and Mrs. Travis 
Hancock, of Bovina will celebrate their Golden 
Wedding Anniversary, on December 2, 1979, from 2 to 
5 p.m.  in the Church of Christ fellowship hall. The 
reception will be hosted by the children of the couple, 
Janie and Matt Moseley, Jannette and Johnnie St. 
Clair, all of Muleshoe and Glen and Carol Hancock, of 
Paris, Texas. The former Kathryn Burns and Travis 
were married December 25, 1929 in Clovis, N .M .

STYLE SHOW . ..November 17, Kristin Chitwood, 
modeled for the style show, held in Lubbock, for the 
W IFE Convention.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Nic­
hols and new baby boy

S t y f e  S k e w

g w d
The National WIFE Con­

vention was held at the 
Lubbock Civic Center on 
Saturday, Nov. 17.

A local designer,  Charlie 
Hanks presented a lunch­
eon style show for the 
ladies and their husbands.

Charlie showed her favor­
ite garments which inclu­
ded custom fit jeans, deco­
rated to co-ordinate with 
the top. Also a line of after 
five wear and some tail­
ored garments featuring 
ultra suede and velour.

Models were little, Kris­
ten Chitwood, whom the 
crowd just loved, also her 
mother,  Sandy, Sheryl 
Waltrip, Teresa and Caro­
tene Hamilton, Marilyn 
Young, Lisa McElroy, 
Jane Saylor, Londa Gunst- 
re am .

Also Michelle and Kay 
Morris, Susie, Sherri and 
Ladd Bessire and Wes 
Hanks.

The show was highly ap ­
plauded and received 
much praise.

Many of the garments 
were made by the elderly 
and handicaped.

Muleshoe

W.I.F.E.
Women Involved in Farm Economics

Has just completed their 
3rd Annual National Convention 
In Lubbock, Texas - Nov. 16-18.

W.I.F.E. Gratefully Acknowledges 
The Support Of These Following 

Merchants:
ALBERTSON'S MENS SHOP 
SOMETHING SPECIAL 
COBB'S DEPARTMENT STORE 
PLAINS AUTO PARTS 
FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
WESTERN 66 COMPANY IN C.
LEAL'S EL NUEVO RESTAURANT 
DECORATORS NURSERY AND FLORAL 
SINGLETON ELLIS FUNERAL HOME 
WESTERN DISTRIBUTING COMPANY 
MULESHOE AUTO PARTS COMPANY 
WINKLER MEAT COMPANY 
WILLIAMS BROS. OFFICE SUPPLY 
MORRISON O IL COMPANY 
MULESHOE STATE BANK 
POYNORS WHITE'S AUTO STORE 
ST. CLAIR'S DEPARTMENT STORE 
JO E SHIPMAN & SONS BODY SHOP 
MULESHOE LIVESTOCK AUCTION IN C . 
FRY & COX TRUE VALUE HARDWARE

NICKLES G IN N IN G  COMPANY 
PEERLESS PY PUMP COMPANY 
LAZBUDDIE FARMERS SUPPLY

DAMRON DRUG
WESTERN AUTO 
IRIS CLEMENTS 
ERNEST KERR 
BECK G IN
WILSON APPLIANCE 
MULESHOE FLORAL 
LAMBERT'S CLEANERS 
MULESHOE ELECTRIC 
CASHWAY GROCERY 
THE FAIR STORE 
WESTERN DURG 
DENT-RM REMPE IN C . 
JAMES CRANE TIRE IN C . 
WOOLEY-HURST IN C .
BOB STOVALL PRINTING 
BAKER FARM SUPPLY 
GULF WHOLESALERS 
POP'S PLACE 
CLAY'S CORNER G IN  
CORRAL RESTAURANT 
SHOOK TIRE COMPANY 
WESTERN SPRINKLERS IN C . 
AMERICAN VALLEY IN C .

TRI-COUNTY SAVINGS & LOAN 
HIGGINBOTHAM BARTLETT COMPANY 

SHIRLEY ANDERSON ELEVATOR-LAZBUDDIE

James Cameron,  have 
moved to the Bula area 
from Memphis,  Tennes­
see. They are staying with 
his parents Mr. and Mrs. 
James Nichols.

•  •  •  *  •

Mrs. Jeryl Bellar was 
admitted into Lubbocks 
Methodist  Hospital last 
Monday to under go some 
testing. While in the hos­
pital children Jeryl Jr.  and 
Cheryl All stayed with 
their grandparents,  Mr. 
and Mrs. E.C. Bellar and 
Mr. and Mrs. O’Don Bel­
lar of Sudan.

Mrs. E.C. Bellar and 
Mrs. O'Don Bellar and 
Jeryl Jr.  and Cheryl Ann

visited Norma Bellar, last 
Wednesday and Friday af­
ternoons during her stay in 
the hospital.

* *  •  •  •

Visiting Mrs. Norma Bel­
lar in the hospital Wed­
nesday and Thursday was 
her mother Mrs. Skeeter 
Lindsey and sisters Vir­
ginia of Dalhart,  and Mrs. 
Rita Mayhew of Dimmitt.  
They retuirned to Dimmitt 
Thursday night after get t ­
ing the doctors reports.

Mrs. John Bellar visited 
Norma Bellar Friday after­
noon in the Hospital.

Mrs. Jeryl Bellar re tur­
ned home from the hospi­
tal Monday afternoon. 

* * * * *
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Soft chiffon late day 
dresses art being shown for 
holiday wear. An attractive 
all over pleated dress fea­
tured a V-necktd bodice with 
long, graceful sleeves cuffed 
at the wrist.

Scarfs play a prominent 
part in fall wear. They vary 
from the tulle, net or metalic- 
sprinklcd scarf to the fur boa 
flung over a shaped suit.

It’s hard to believe but 
this is the next-to- the-last 
month of the year. Have 
you made good use of the 
first ten months?

Most people favor any­
thing which promises to 
re turn something for 
nothing, or much for little.

Hunters are reminded 
that this is the season 
forest fires cost millions of 
dollars.

CAR-SENSE

Linda Nowell
Something to femember when you buy a new car which ia 

many times not given much thought • and that it .  the type 
interior you should have One ol the major things to 
remember - is how you will use the car. It you have 
children, it might be the most practical would be vinyl 
which is easy to keep clean Vou may want velour which is 
the most comfortable, however, the hardest to keep clean 
Another item is the color- get a color inside which pleases 
you and is both warm and cool The companies have gone 
all out these last lew years to please the customer with the 
interior--! think we will have an interior which will please

Muleshoe Motor Co.
1225 W. Arner. Blvd. 272-4251

Men's
Munsingwear

Sweaters

jU i*»

Look smashing at the Holidoy porties in 
this coordinate group from Russ Togs.' 
Eosy-core blend of 55%  polyester-45 % 
Acrylic knit. Colors ore Block and Brown 
Sizes 10-18 and S-M-L.

ENTIRE
STOCK

A. Pull-on Pont, Reg $15
B. Skirt, Reg $15.
C. Blazer, Reg. $28.
D. LS Print shirt,

Reg. $17.
E. LS Print shirt,

Reg $17.
F. Cordigon Sweater,

Reg. $17.

Men's (%

Insulated > 
(ove ralls^

A . Nylon lo cket w ith front 
zipper and  zipper pockets

B Nylon short iacke t w ith  pile 
co lla r, rib  kn it c u ffs  and 
w a ist

Z ip  front w arm  velour 
robe w ith  s ty lish  q u ilt 
ed satin  co lla r in  co n­
trasting  color. Colors 
Burgundy and Brown. 
S izes S-M -L

rOhvewood in su la ted  co ve ra ll 
m 10 0 °o  cotton shell, 100°o 
nylon red lin in g , 8 8 °0 Doc 
ron"' poly f ille d  Two top 
zipper p ickets, 2 lower s lash  
pockets 2 back  p atch  p oc­
kets lone button t h r u ' ,  b i- 
sw ing b ock , e la stic  in b ack  
w a istb and , zipper to knees 
on legs ond 2-w ay zippers 
Sizes S -M -L -X L  in short, 
reg u la r and  tall

Fa ll colors 
S z e s  S -M -L -X L

Full Sixe 
Single Control 
Reg. $28.

AUTOMATIC AND
JUNIOR
COATS,

Luxu rio us  fabric 
b lend o f 8 0 %
and  2 0 %  a c ry lic  w ith fu ll 2 year 
w a rran ty  For a ll night com fort con 
trol au to m a tica lly  ad |u sts  to room tern 
pero ture  C o lo rs : Brown, B lue , Green 0  Gold

V I "  so ld i colei velour with 
o ire fu l sa lt  textu re  unit 
lustrous colors I I  w ill take 
you com fortab ly through 
Oil the d iffe re n t o x |n \ts  ot 
your life  Ma» bine wash 
o i h I d i s a b i l i t y
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Hance Cosponsor
Deportation Bill

COMING THROUGH---Muleshoe Mules'  quarterback Mike Northcutt rambles 
through with the ball and is shown just before he was hit in the bi-district playoff 
game against Idalou Friday afternoon. The Mules will be the home team at Canyon 
next Friday night when they go up against the Childress Bobcats.

WASHINGTON -  U.S. 
Rep. Kent Hance announ­
ced that he has cospon­
sored a bill which calls for 
deportation of Iranian s tu­
dents who participate in 
activities which abuse Am­
erican hospitality.

The bill. H.R. 5813 by 
U.S. Rep. Jack Hightower 
(D. Texas), calls for the 
immediate deportation of 
foreign students who parti­
cipate in activities “ which 
are inconsistent”  with 
their primary purpose of 
being in the United States.

“ We allow foreign s tu ­
dents to come to the 
United States for a formal 
educat ion,” said Hance. 
“ But when they become 
involved in any activities 
such as we have seen 
lately, then our hospitality

M ules.
Cont. From Page 1.

With still another chance 
to tie up the game, the 
Wildcats again failed to 
come through giving the 
Mules another shot at the 
endzone.

This time, it was Jim 
(Bones) Norman, who sca­
mpered off to his left and 
swept into the endzone on 
a nine yard run at 1:09 of 
the third. The elated 
Mules and Mule fans wat­
ched as Whalin’s kick was 
true and the Mules gained 
a 27-13 lead.

During the fourth quar­
ter, the Mules held the 
frustrated ‘Cats'  without a 
first down and Coach Mike 
Wartes put in Monti Van­
diver, backup quarterback.

Parade •••
Cont. From Page 1.

will show unfinished wood 
works; Jerrell Otwell will 
have turquoise jewelry; 
Irad Arnold of Tucumcari 
will have hand carved 
birds and Pearl Wood and 
Judy Moore of Canyon will 
have hand made and cro­
chet items.

Mike and Judy Smith of 
Plainview will be showing 
wood candle boxes and 
Neva Gray of Muleshoe 
will have molded chocolate 
candy, ceramics and croch­
eted vests.

Other booths will feature 
hand painted china; oil and 
water colors; pen and ink 
windmill prints; various 
types of jewelry; silk flo­
wers, macrame, dolls, tole 
painting and other wood 
items.

“ Attend the bazaar and 
see what handcrafted it­
ems would fit the names 
on your Christmas list,” 
suggested a member of the 
Moonlight Home Exten­
sion Club.

r

He also freely substituted 
during the final quarter of 
the game, as the scoring 
ended on the 27-13 score.

The Mules dominated the 
yardage statistics with 249 
on the ground and 47 yards 
in the air for 296 yards to 
130 on the ground and 44 
yards in the air for Idalou.

Also, the Mules had IS 
first downs to 12 for Ida­
lou. Mike Northcutt com­
pleted three of four passes 
at tempted and was inter­
cepted one time and Brad 
DeBusk completed four of 
12 passes and was not 
intercepted.  There were no 
fumbles in the game by 
either team.

Muleshoe had five penal ­
ties for 40 yards and Idalou 
had one penalty for five 
yards.

Gold Star.
Cont. From Page 1. 
as a nation.

“ No organization can do 
more to equip you to 
become our leaders than 
this organization you are 
currently involved in -- 
4-H.”

Master  of ceremonies 
was State Rep. Jim Rudd 
of Brownfield. 4-H’ers 
Steve Smith of Yoakum 
County and Kim Reese of 
Terry County narrated the 
awards presentation.

Hosts for the banquet 
were 12 member-owned 
electric cooperatives serv­
ing the counties in Exten­
sion District Two. Welco­
ming the guests on behalf 
of the cooperatives was 
Jim Payne, general  mana­
ger of Lyntegar Electric 
Cooperative, Tahoka. Ch­
uck Senter of Dawson Co­
unty, District Two 4-H 
Council chairman, respon­
ded.

Dinner music was provi­
ded by 4-H’ers on the 
program were

GENERAL ELECTRIC
FROSTED BULBS

MAGOO 
SPREADS 

THE 
NEWS,

LIGHT 
FOR 
THE

SHORTER 
DAYLIGHT 

HOURS STOCK 
_  UP
—  AND
rv l SAVE
I j j  SPECIAL 

VALUE

/ 1 1 94 1

401 S. lit!

Muleshoe
2 7 2 -4 5 1 1

The Speaker 
'i'll Reports

AUSTIN— With the recent 
passage of Proposition 3, 
the Family Farm and Ranch 
Security Program, many 
persons interested in enter­
ing agriculture may now 
have a chance to do so with 
the assistance of the State 
of Texas.

The Family Farm and 
Ranch Security Program es­
tablishes a guaranteed loan 
program for the purchase of 
farm and ranch land by 
persons at the entry-level of 
agriculture. It will aid 
persons who otherwise 
would be unable to meet the 
high price of agricultural 
land. Those persons inter­
ested in the program should 
remember, however, that it 
is a program in which the 
state guarantees the loans 
but is not actually the lend­
ing institution. The actual 
loans will come from a 
normal lending institution, 
such as a bank, Farmers 
Home Administration, etc.

The loan guarantees will 
be issued to qualified bor­
rowers through the sale of 
$10 million in general obli­
gation bonds of the State of 
Texas. A nine-member ad­
visory council appointed by 
the Governor will review all 
applications and make rec­
ommendations to the Ag­
riculture Commissioner. 
According to a staff
member of the Agriculture 
Department, the Governor 
could make his appoint­
ments and have tire council 
functioning within the next 
year.

Until the council is ap­
pointed, all interested
persons should out their

by Bill Clayton
names on a waiting list that 
the Texas Department of 
Agriculture has begun for 
information concerning the 
program. As soon os the 
application forms are pre­
pared they will be sent to 
those people whose names 
appear on the list.

To be eligible for a loan 
guarantee, the applicant 
must be a U. S. citizen and 
a Texas resident for five 
years; have a net worth of 
less than $100,000, exclud­
ing the value of residential 
homestead; intend to use 
the land for farming or 
ranching purposes; and have 
the necessary education and 
training in the type of farm­
ing and ranching they wish 
to pursue.

PRICES INCREASES
The worst rate of inflation 

in 33 years continued its as­
sault on Americans’ pocket- 
books in 33 years continued 
its assault on Americans' 
pocketbooks in September as 
consumer prices increased 
another 1.1 percent, the gov­
ernment said.

Bailftlounl' Journal (WHOM*
„  W .1 . .  «“  *  S . . . ^ l  «»■ Mt.l. sh.w
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should end and they sho­
uld be sent home.”

"O ur  first concern regar­
ding the Iranian incident is 
for the safety and welfare 
of the American hoata- 
g e s . ”  he added.  " W e  
must make the negotiation 
for their return as our first 
priority. However,  should 
the life of any of those hos­
tages be seriously endang­
ered,  then I feel im mediate 
military action is warran­
ted .”

“ We are dealing with an 
extremely sensitive inter­
national si tuation,”  said 
the Texas congressman.  
“ It requires delicate hand­
ling and wise decisions. 
The Iranian authorities 
have made a joke of tradi­
tional international law 

,and human decency."
“ Our actions must be 

sure,  and they must be 
right. I'm firmly convinced 
we need to make a strong 
stand because the eyes of 
the world are on this 
incident. What  we do will 
set a precedent upon 
which other countries will 
base their relations with 
the United States. It is 
time for the United States 
to stand up and be coun­
ted .”

WHO KNOWS?
1. Who wrote Cull o f  the 
Wild?
2. Who became the ninth 
contender for the GOP 
nomination?
3. Identify the Constitu­
tion party.
4. How many active vol­
canoes are there in the 
world?
5. Who was the Democrat 
opposing Dwight Eisen­
hower for president?
6. Rutgers University is 
in what state?
7. How many calories are 
there in a cup of raisins?
8. What is the Indiana 
state motto?
9. Define billet-doux.
10. Who invented the elec­
tric stove?

Answers To Who Knows
1. Jack London.
2. Howard Baker.
3. A newly formed U.S. 
political party.
4. 850.
5. Adlai E. Stevenson.
6. New Jersey.
7. 420 calories.
8. Crossroads of Amer­
ica.
9. A love letter.
10. Hadaway, U.S.,  in 
189b.

• * * *
An u n s u c c e s s f u l  

organizer is one unable to 
get other people to do the 
work.
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Cornin’  in  fo r good
1422 W. Amer. Blvd. 

Muleshoe

Supreme. 
5 Toppings

Good.

i;
I I

L i

M s a
-Hut

$2 off h large Supreme.
Or $1 off a medium Supreme.
The pizza thafs loaded with cheese, 
mushrooms, onions, ^rcen peppers, 
nepperoni and pork topping 
You f i in ’t top a deal like that.

I
I
I
I
I
I

ONE INJURY RECORDED—Jo Wood was driver of the vehicle above when she ran 
into the back of a cotton trailer being towed by Concepcion Rejino Thursday night, 
north of Muleshoe.  Rejino, who was also towing another trailer of cotton behind a 
pickup, was not injured. Mrs. Wood was treated and hospitalized at West Plains 
Medical Center.

Stand-By Generators Important
COLLEGE STATION-- 

Emergency stand-by elec­
tric generators proved 
their worth to Texas farms 
and ranches this year 
when flooding and torna­
does caused power fail­
ures.

"A stand-by generator is 
a good investment on any 
farm with mechanically ve­
ntilated production facili­
ties, bulk milk handling 
equipment ,  mechanical 
feeding equipment ,  or fa­
cilities requiring continu­
ous heat,  such as broo­
d e r s , ” points out Dr. Gary 
Nelson. Nelson is an agri­
cultural engineer with the 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, Texas A&M 
University System.

Nelson points out that 
stand-by generators are 
either engine driven or 
tractor driven; stationary 
or portable; manual or 
automatic start; and pow­
ered by gasoline, bottled 
gas or diesel fuel.

“ Generators must  pro­
vide the same type of 
power at the same voltage 
and frequency as that sup­
plied by power l ines,” he 
explains. “ This is usually 
120 or 240 volt single 
phase,  60 cycle alternating 
current .”

For generators  up to 15 
kilowatts, an air-cooled en ­
gine is often used. A 
liquid-cooled engine is ne­
cessary for larger genera­
tors. The engine must 
have about a two and one 
quar ter hp capacity with 
the proper drive system for 
each 1,000 watts of gener­
ator output.

“ A full load system will 
handle the entire farm­
stead load,"  says Nelson. 
“ Automatic engine-
powered full-load systems 
will begin to furnish power 
immediately, or up to 30 
seconds after power goes 
off.”

The engineer points out 
that small, less expensive 
part-load systems may be 
enou gh to handle essen­
tial equipment  during an 
emergency.

Power-take-off genera t­
ors are about half as costly 
as engine-operated units. 
Under a part-load system, 
only the most essential 
equipment is operated at 
one time. This would be 
adequate for most farms. 
Hbwever, the generator 
must be sized to keep 
certain necessary equip­
ment,  such as a milk cooler 
or ventilation fan, running 
continuously while provid­
ing enough extra power to 
start large noncontinuous 
equipment,  such as a m e­

chanical feeder.
“ Check with your electri­

cian or power supply rep­
resentative for installation 
instructions since wiring 
and equipment must be 
installed according to ap­
plicable national codes, lo­
cal ordinances and requir­
ements  of the power supp­
lier,”  says Nelson. “ Lo­
cate large engine genera­
tors in a heated,  well- 
ventilated building, away 
from combust ibles.”

An automatic stand-by 
unit should start automat i­
cally when power fails and 
stop when power is re ­
stored. When using an 
engine-driven generator 
with a manual start,  or 
when using a tractor- 
driven unit, first bring the 
generator up to speed. 
Then start the largest mo­
tor first and add other 
loads when each is up to 
operating speed,  explains 
the engineer.

Outgoing O'Leary say oil 
problems to get worse.

E Hwry 60

W E S T

364 5961

______HEREFORD__
Pre-Christmas SaleALL Mens 7JT • l

Boots X  3 0  % T X * .
African Antelope s\*S
Boots $ 1 0 1 50
Great Selection Of 
16" Top All
Boots 30%  Off

$ 8 4

0 Boots * * * 1 4 0

Mens Long Sleeve
S h irts.

S 1 2 95 3 / * 3 6

Justin Ropers
Reg. *95 $ 6 5 ° °

Justin Elephant
Ropers

Reg. '220 * 1 5 4
Cowboy Cut

Wranglers $ 12 95
20% Off Tempco Down

Jackets & VestsReg. Sale
Ml 4 $91
M06 $86*92............... $75

*86................. $75
*56 $45
*50................. *39

<>m* coupon pirpiitls prrvi*tl at pnrlmnitinK l*i«a Hut restaurant* _
Offrr K«M*|«tnlv i»n nnular menu prion* tnnnikh

Christmas Items: Cuspidors, Name Belts, 
Billfolds, Belt Buckles, Snuff Can Lids

Open Till 8:00 M on. - Sat.
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DANNY JAMES MILLEI

Services For 
Danny Miller 
Held Saturday
Funeral  services for Dan­

ny James Miller, 21, of 
Hawley, will be held Sa­
turday at 2 p.m. in the 
Chapel of Chimes, with 
Rev. Gene Davis, Assem­
bly of God Minister officia­
ting, assisted by Eddie 
Riley, Bula Baptist Church 
M inister.

Burial will be in the 
Muleshoe Cemetery under 
the direction of Singleton- 
EHis Funeral Directors.

Danny died Nov. 23, in 
West  Plains Medical Cen­
ter. He was a member  of 
Hicks Chapel Baptist Ch­
urch, of Stegall.

Survivors include his par­
ents,  Mr. and Mrs. Alford 
Miller, Hawley. Three sis­
ters, Mrs. Dovie Knowles 
of Muleshoe and Mrs. 
Mary Jo Bond of Olney 
and Miss Darla Sue Miller 
of Hawley. One brother, 
Eddie of Muleshoe.

*
i m m

Tom Watson 
Services Held 
Sunday
Services for William 

Thomas Watson Sr. (Tom) 
78, will be held Sunday at 
2 p.m.  in the First Assem­
bly Church with Rev. Joe 
Stone, Pastor assisted by 
Rev. J .W.  Farmer ,  Dist. 
Supt. of Lubbock and Rev. 
Gene Davis.

Burial will be in Bailey 
County Memorial Park un ­
der the direction of Single- 
ton Ellis Funeral Home. 

Tom was born Sept. 10, 
1901 in Amory, Miss, and 
died in West Plains Medi­
cal Center,  November 23.

He was a farmer and 
member of the First As­
sembly of God Church of 
M uleshoe.

Survivors include his 
wife, Nettie, four sons, 
Delbert,  and W.T. Jr. of 
Muleshoe,  Buford of San 
Antonio and Leo of Lub­
bock.

Services For 
Mildred Andrews

Funeral services for a 
long time Muleshoe resi ­
dent, Mildred T. Andrews 
85, will be held at 10 a.m. 
Saturday, in the First Bap- 
t is tChurch,  with Rev. J .E.  
Meeks, Pastor of First Ba­
ptist Church, with Rev. 
J.E. Meeks,  Pastor of First 
Baptist Church officiating.

Graveside services will be 
held in Spur cemetery with 
Rev. Norris Taylor officia­
ting.

Mildred had been a Mul­
eshoe resident for 24 
years, and was a member 
of the First Baptist Ch­
urch.

She is survived by her 
husband,  Bill Andrews, 
and one brother,  Duke 
Daniel of Iredell, Tx.

BRIEFS

MRS. MILDRED 
ANDREWS

President calls for in­
creased troops in Caribbean.

Senate freezes pay: ap­
proves emergency funds.

Banks hike prime lending 
rate to 13'/a percent.

Congress approves canal 
legislation.

ARIS

THE DRIVING GLOVE WITH AMAZING

• the one glove that's perfect for driving, 
shopping, riding, cycling... everything!

• makes hands feel supple, relaxed, delight­
fully flexible!

America’s most popular glove, smartly styled 
with leather strips on palm to grasp the wheel 
firmly, handsome leather chevrons on back. 
The unique iso-massage action is made pos­
sible by a special blend of Antron'-Nylon- 
Lycra'-Spandex in every exciting fashion color 
— and they’re washable! ONE SIZE FITS ALL^

Price:

321 M AIN MULESHOE

n / / i o n i /L
C fi a n t  h  O n  v C O

Two daughters,  Mrs. Roy 
Stewart of Truth of Conse­
quences,  N.M. and Mrs. 
Ed Dudley of Amarillo. 
One sister, Mrs. Lavera 
Nickols of Lubbock. Two 
brothers,  Clyde Watson of 
Waco and Charlie Watson 
of M uleshoe.

Mulching mowers 
recycle nutrients

COLLEGE STATION — 
Mulching lawnmowers that cut 
up grass clippings and deposit 
them back in the lawn are an 
excellent way to recycle plant 
nutrients, says lawn care ex­
pert Dr. J. B. Beard, a profes­
sor in Texas A&M University’s 
Department of Soil and Crop 
Sciences.

Although the mulching 
mowers eliminate the raking 
and bagging of cut grass, there is 
some concern that returned 
clippings will form thatch, a 
layer of dense brown organic 
debris that can cause great prob­
lems for homeowners.

Beard contends there is no 
truth to the theory that grass 
clippings contribute to thatch 
build-up.

"On the contrary,” he says, 
"the disposal of clippings is 
wasteful. There are nutrients in 
grass that are beneficial to a 
lawn and if they are not re­
turned in some manner, fer­
tilizer must be added instead."

Collins Urges 
Welfare Cuts
WASHINGTON -The Ho­

use passed an Administra­
tion backed, liberal wel­
fare “ reform” plan that

t

will cost American taxpay­
ers an additional S3 billion 
for the first year it is in 
Operation, Congressman 
Jim Collins of Texas said.

“ 1 would not call this 
welfare bill a ‘reform’ bill. 
What  has been created is 
the beginning of a socialis­
tic. guaranteed national in­
come,"  Collins warned.

The bill, H.R. 4904, re­
quires all states to support 
eligible families at 65 per­
cent of the poverty level. 
This means  a guaranteed 
income for these welfare 
families of about $4700 a 
year.

Collins supported an alt­
ernative Republican plan 
that would have allowed 
for expanded work requir­
ements  for welfare appli­
cants and that would have 
given block grants to cer­
tain states to set up a 
program that best suited

their needs.  Thii al terna­
tive plan was narrowly 
defeated 205-200.

“ There is little work in­
centive in this welfare 
plan. All that is going to 
happen is that the welfare 
rolls will be expanded by 
over 100,000 families and 
that low-to-middle income 
taxpayers will have to foot 
the bill for this give-away 
program,”  Collins said.

The bill passed the House 
by a 222-184 vote and now 
must go to the Senate for 
approval.

“ Welfare is the one area 
the folks back home in 
Texas tell me we should 
start cutting. Texas has 
one of the lowest welfare 
levels in the country. Our 
average monthly AFDC 
(Aid to Families with De­
pendent  Children) paym­
ent is $108.44 per family, 
S34.91 per recipient. In 
New York, the average 
monthly AFDC payment  
per family is $372.05 and

$121.52 per recipient.
“ Government  deficit 

spending causes our incre­
asing inflation rate and 
increased taxes. Welfare 
needs to be cut not increa­
sed and it is time the 
liberals in the House real­
ized th is ,”  Collins said.

BIBLE VERSE
"Man looketh on the 

outward appearance, but 
the Lord looketh on the 
heart. ”

1. To whom was this 
verse spoken?
2. By whom was it 
spoken?
3. In connection with 
what incident?
4. Where may the verse 
be found?

Answers To Bible Verse
1. To the Prophet 
Samuel.
2. By Jehovah.
3. The anointing of 
David, the son of Jesse.
4. 1 Samuel 16:7b.

Big Summer Potato Harvest 
Assures Supply for Spud Lovers

AUSTIN-With September 
marking the completion of the 
summer potato harvest, 
lovers ol the spud can now 
rest assured of large home­
grown supplies in Texas this 
winter.

Current estimates for the 
Texas summer potato crop, at 
262,500,000 pounds, are 14 
percent above last year’s 
harvest. Yields are expected 
to average 25,000 pounds per 
acre compared with 21,000 a 
year ago. explained Agnculture
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown.

Harvest  of summer  
potatoes  was nearing 
completion by the beginning 
of September, according to 
the Texas Crop and Livestock 
Reporting Service report, 
with only a few fields 
remaining to be harvested in 
the following weeks.

“And for the most part,”
Commissioner Brown said,
“size and yield this year are
very good "* * * *

A successful politician 
rarely offends an organ­
ized group during an elec­
tion year.

Singleton-E ll is  Funeral Home
24 Hour Ambulance Service 

Ph.272-4574 Muleshoe

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Ave. C 
Dana Shunko, Pastor

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
130 W. Ave. G.
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION
Ave. D and Fifth jjtreet 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastpr

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
H.D. Hunter, Pastor 
Morton Highway

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C
PROGRESS SECOND 
BAPTIST CHURCH
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin 
507 West Second. Muleshoe

ST. JOHN LUTHERAN
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a .m .
Worship Services 
11:00 a.m .

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowens

MULESHOE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
David Cox, minister 
Clovis Highway

JEHOVAH WITNESS
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

IMMAC ULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH
Father Terry Burke 
Northeast of City in' Morrison 
Edition

MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD
517 S. First 
Rev. Joe Stone

LAND OF PLENTY

★  THANKSGIVING F OR . . .
• PROSPEROUS NATION
• FOOD
• A STRONG NATION
• FREEDOM OF WORSHIP

Pages could be filled with ways that 
God has blessed us, and we should be 
continually thankful for God’s good­
ness. At this time, however, we should 
pause from our daily workday habits 
and in unison, give special thanks to 
God, that we still have freedom of 
worship.

Attend church this Thanksgiving 
weekend

The Church is God s appointed agency in this world 
for spreading the knowledge of His love for man and 
of His demand for mon to respond to that love by 
loving his neighbor Without this grounding in the 
love of God, no government or society or woy of life 
w ill long persevere and the freedoms which we hold 
so deor will inevitably perish. Therefore, even from 
a selfish point of view, one should support the Church 
for the sake of the welfare of himself and his family, 
leyond that, however, every person should uphold 
and participate in the Church because it tells the truth 
about man's life, death and destiny; the truth which 
alone w ill set him free fo live  as a child of God.

C o le m an  A d v  Sent.

EMMANUEL BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel
107 E. Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor

RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST 
CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D 
Roy L. Sikes, Pastor

SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION
Rev. Ynes Aleman 
East Third and Ave. E.

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH
314 Ave. B 
Rev. Gene Prevo

LONGVIEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Pastor B.C. Sronecipher 
ph 946-3413

St. Mathew Bap. Church, 
Corner of West Boston & 
West Birch.
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor

SIXTEENTH AND AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday-10:30 a.m.
Evening-6 p.m.
Wednesday-8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister

PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH
Progress, Texas
Rev. Gearld Albers, Pastor

NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor

MULESHOE BAPTIST 
CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G.
Bob Dodd, Pastor

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E.
Rev. J.E. Meeks

Muleshoe Home 
Center, Inc.

WATSON ALFALFA
272-3552 272-4038

BRATCHER MOTOR 
SUPPLY

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

Main Street Beauty  
Salon

115 Main 272-3448

ROBERT GREEN INC.
Your Oldsmobile, GMC, Pontiac, 

Buick Dealer
W. Hwy. 84 272-4588

MULESHOE
C O -O P

GINS

ST. CLAIRS
110 Main

Kemp’s Discount 
Furniture

1210 W. Air er. Blvd. 272-5023

Ana’s House Of 
Beauty

109 E. Ave. B_________ 272-4152

WHITES CASHWAY 
GROCERY

402 Main
"Where Friends Meet and Prices Talk"

Muleshoe

D EN T-R EM  PE 
IMPLEMENT CO.

John Deere Dealer
272-4297

MULESHOE 
PUBLISHING CO.

Muleshoe 272-4536

WESTERN DRUG
114 Main

WESTERN SPRINKLERS
INC.

z im u T tc
W. Hwy. 84 
272-4544

4 Dairq 
Queen

Margie Hawkins, 
Manager

272 3412

MULESHOE BODY SHOP
402 N .lst 272- 4246
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Sudan News
By Evelyn Ritchie

The Sudan Young Home­
makers met Monday, Nov. 
5 at 7:30 p.m. for their 
November meeting.

Norma introduced Nita 
Loyd, from Pioneer Natu­
ral Gas, in Lubbock. She 
presented a program on 
Holiday foods and crafts.

During the business mee­
ting, Carol Williams was 
elected “ Little Sister” .

The Christmas Party will 
be held Dec. at 7:30 p.m. 
The next meeting will be 
held Dec. 3 in Dimmitt.

Ann Carson, hostess, 
served refreshments which 
Nita prepared.

Attending were Jan 
Smith, Rita Conley, Pam 
Maxwell, Joan Goston, 
Ann Carson, Norma Bur­
nett, Kim Hurst  and Jana 
Synatschl.

Mr. and Mrs. Jay House, 
of Andrew, were Sudan 
visitors last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Don 
Parrott of Amarillo, were 
recent visitors with his 
mother, Mrs. Jean Muller 
and Joe Don was a pall­
bearer for Dorvin Reid 
services Friday.

Steve Ritchie enplaned 
Sunday for his home in 
Redlands, Calif, after spe­
nding the weekend with 
his parents,  Mr. and Mrs. 
G.C. Ritchie. He was a 
member of the Riner-Ham 
wedding party Saturday 
night. Joining them were 
his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dewayne Phillips, Christie 
and Michael.

Prayers are the stairs that 
lead to God.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Nelson 
were in Seminole and 
Brownfield on business 
last week.

Recent visitors, with Mr. 
and Mrs. Claud Kropp, 
were their grandchildren, 
Terry Waller, Kirk, and 
Kyle Mixchew of Here­
ford.

Mr. and Mrs. Sterling 
Reese have returned home

from vacationing at Lake of 
the Pines for the past 
several weeks.

Mrs. D.W. Williamson 
and Mrs. Wayne Rogers 
took Mrs. Jack Enefrom to 
lunch one day last week for 
her birthday. Happy Birth­
day Romona.

Mrs.  Charles Logan and 
Mrs. Dewey Coldiron were 
in Clovis Tuesday on busi ­
ness and for dinner.

Natasha Diane Bruta, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jodsin Bruton, of Level- 
land spent the past week 
with her grandparents,  
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Nelson.

Recent visitors in the 
home of Mrs. Crouch was 
her daughter ,  and son in 
law, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Goodyear of Arlington and 
Mr. and Mrs. Davis. They 
had been to the mount­
ains deer hunting.

Pam Bruton, visited with 
her parents,  Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Nelson Friday. She 
came to get Natashe who 
has been visiting her 
grandparents  this last 
week.

“ When in doubt,  tell the 
t ru th . ” ---Mark Twain

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Rich's son, Charles Rich, 
Jr.  and son of Los Angeles 
Calif, recently surprised 
them with a short visit. 
They had not been toge­
ther in three years. Char­
les Jr. is with the Arm­
oured Truck Service in 
L.A.

"Jealousy and love are 
s is ters .”

The Claude Kropps, re­
cently were in Silverton 
and Lockney visiting with 
friends.

Wynelle Williams and 
Hazel May, were in Mid­
land, over the weekend for 
an Art Show.

Visiting with her parents,  
Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Logan over the weekend 
was their daughter,  Mrs. 
Lynda Hunter,  and child­
ren, Doug, Cari, and John

of Amarillo. They also 
visited with grandparents  
Mr. and Mrs.  Roy Day. 

Visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Day, 
Sunday, was their daugh-

The
Sandhills

Editor’s note: The Sand­
hill Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm adds 
his two-bits to a current 
controversy this week.
Dear editor:

As 1 understand it, Chry­
sler corporation needs fi­
nancial help because it's 
been losing money making 
long cars when short ones 
are now in style, and 
Washington is coming to 
the rescue.

If if works out the govern­
ment will arrange about a 
billion and a half loan. 
Private banks would put 
up the money and the 
government  would guaran ­
tee r e p ay m en t .

I guess this is all right but 
i sn’t it backwards? I mean, 
considering the financial 
shape of the government,  
wouldn’t it be a better loan 
if it put up the money and 
the banks guaranteed re­
payment?

Now as to what Chrysler 
will do with the money, 
that requires some th ­
ought. In addition to cars it 
needs a flexible product 
easily adapted to a chang­
ing market,  like for exam­
ple women’s dresses.  If 
the style changes from 
long ones to short ones, 
you don’t see dress manu­
facturers caught with rows 
and rows of long dresses 
parked on their back lot. 
They just whack ’em off 
and stay in business.  But 
have you ever tried to 
shorten a long car? Inci­
dentally 1 wouldn’t recom­
mend Chrysler 's making 
swim suits. Shorten them 
any more and you’re out of 
the swim suit business al­
together.

Let's change the subject. 
I don' t  know how smart all 
the candidates for Presi ­
dent are, but it must be 
something less than the 
owners of professional 
football teams. They figu­
red out long ago fans can 
take just so many games 
before they get bored, so 
the season runs from Sep­
tember to January and the 
money rolls in. But the 
Presidential candidates 
are trying to make their 
game a year-long one, 
from November of this 
year to November of next 
year. I don' t  see how 
they’re going to keep the 
fans from getting bored. 
And all but one of the 
bunch will lose money. 
Yours faithfully,
J. A.

FOR A SM ALL MONTHLY CHARGE, 
SHE COULD’VE

ANSWERED IT BY THE DRYER.
Every time Barbara Phillips phone rings, 

it's long distance- the distance from her to 
her phone, that is.

If you spend a lot of time running to the 
phone, maybe you re in the running for an 
extension phone. For much less than you d 
expect, you can start reaching for your

Q D  EXTENSION PHONES

phone Whether you re stuck in the laundry 
room, glued to the TV or deep in sleep 

What's more, you know you've got a 
phone that's as reliable as the phone com­
pany So the next time you run to the phone, 
caH your General Telephone business office 
And moke it the last time.

h CaHif* • • M lW  in most *'*»*

ter and husband,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  Jack Noblett of Lub­
bock.

HELLO WORLD 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve 

Nelko of Diana, Texas are 
the parents of a boy, 
Nicholos Sterling. The lit­
tle lad was born in the 
Good Shepherd Hospital in 
Longview, on Sept. 29. 
Nicholos weighed 8 lbs. 
and 1 ounce and was 21

inches long.
The grandparents  are 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Tho­
mas of Diana and Mr. and 
Mrs. Nelko of Pittsburg, 
Pa.

Among the great grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Sterling Reese of Sudan 
and Mrs. Hattie Dudgeon 
of Post, Texas.

Mrs. Nelko is the former 
Debbie King formerly of 
Sudan.

WASHINGTON -  Higher 
food costs and less effi­
cient production could re ­
sult from national policy 
alternatives now under di­
scussion to change the 
structure of agriculture, an 
economist from Texas A& 
M University warned here.

Dr. Ronald D. Knutson,  
professor and economist 
with the Texas Agricul­
tural Experiment Station 
and Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, challen­
ged national leaders and 
economists at the National 
Outlook Conference in Wa- 
shington, D.C. to base 
their analyses on “ facts 
instead of emotions of the 
issue. ’ ’

Knutson noted that not 
all large farms are corpor­
ate farms.

“ Many, in fact, have the 
farm family as a base for 
management  even though 
they may hire significant 
labor and thus not fall 
within the USDA family 
farm definition.

Knutson also questioned 
some conventional econo­
mic viewpoints which por­
tray smaller farms as the 
most efficients.

He cited studies which 
show substantial efficiency 
gains beyond the normal 
$100,000 in sales that is 
used to divide large farm 
agriculture from smaller 
and medium size farms. 
Knutson was critical of 
studies which conclude 
that farms in the $20,000 
to $100,000 sales range are 
most efficient, since the 
studies allow no cost for 
farm family labor, manag­
ement  or capital.

“ Policy decisions based 
on this technique would 
imply that the U.S. is 
willing to continue to ex­
ploit middle size farms,”  
Knutson said.

Knutson also questioned 
the current belief that food 
prices will increase if t r­
ends toward large scale 
agriculture continue.

He noted that during the 
past 30 years,  when inte­
gration of the broiler in­
dustry was taking place, 
broiler prices remained 
constant despite inflation. 
“ Yet the real price decli­
ned 45 percent and con­
sumption more than dou­
b led ,"  Knutson said.

While the fed beef indu-

Consumer prices rise dims 
hope of downing inflation.

stry is not as highly con­
centrated and integrated 
as the broiler industry, 
there is no evidence that 
large scale coordinated 
feedlots result in higher 
meat prices, the economist 
added.

“ Warnings of economists 
about adverse long term 
consequences of large 
scale intergrated agricul­
ture have not material­
ized,”  he observed.

The outlook for the struc­
ture of agriculture is a 
continuation of the trend 
toward large scale agricul­
ture, Knutson said.

He warned that trends 
toward large scale coordi­
nated animal agriculture 
may have progressed to 
the point that they are not 
reversible on either politi­
cal or economic grounds.  
Implications of such struc­
tural changes in animal 
agriculture for crop pro­
duction are not as sharply 
defined, he said.

“ An important factor t re­
nding toward more con­
tracting in crop production 
could be a combination of 
integration in livestock 
with a relatively tight 
world supply-demand bal­
ance for gra ins ,"  he said.

Knutson expressed con­
cern in assessing policy 
options, he explained, in­
clude taxing large scale 
farm equipment ,  progres­
sive property taxes, restri­
cting public research and 
extension activities to help 
small farmers,  and depri ­
ving large farmers of lower 
interest supported govern­
ment credit.

“ The U.S. position as a 
world efficient food pro­
duction leader resulted 
from a decision to invest in 
research, make it publicly 
available and allow the 
competitive system to op­
erate.  Reversing this pol­
icy would be counter to 
such national public con­
cerns as controlling infla­
tion, increasing producti­
vity and expor ts ,"  Knut­
son declared.

As a more suitable policy 
alternative, he suggested 
more emphasis on provid­
ing farmers the coordina­
tion and investment requi­
red to build a cooperative 
system that can com pete in 
tomorrow’s agriculture. It 
is important,  however, 
that  farmers be given the 
opportunity to make that 
choice," Knutson said.

Extend 
Your Wheat 

Pasture
By Feeding Baled 

Native Grass Hay.

*56°° Per Ton 
Out O f Stack

Still Have A Few Lose 
Stacks *30 Ton On 

A Turn Row.

Bamert Seed
f f t  272-4787
V V * M uleshoe.,

m

i

Lazbuddie
Longhorn
Stampede

Sherrie Seaton scored 18 
points for Lazbuddie and 
was assisted by Barbie Ivy, 
Terri Clark, and Susan 
Glover, each with six po­
ints.

Farm Structure Issues 
Need Factual Analyses

by Janet Wilke
The Lazbuddie Lady 

Longhorns were ripped by 
the Three Way Eaglettes 
Tuesday,  Nov. 6, in the 
first basketball  game of 
the season.

In the Junior varsity 
game,  the Horns fought 
back from a 20-16 deficit in 
the third quar ter only to 
lose 33-26. High point in 
the game was shared by 
three Longhorns, Kim Gr­
egory, Lori Ivy, and Rachel 
Summar,  each with eight 
points a piece. High point 
for Three Way was, Laura 
Latimes with 14.

In the Varsity game, the 
final score was 56-42 in 
favor of the Eaglettes.

Senior Terri Clark popped 
the net with 18 points for 
Three W ay.

In a rematch on Tuesday, 
Nov. 13, the junior varsity 
Horns overcame the Eagl­
ettes by three, 30-27,

Lori Ivy scored ten points 
for Lazbuddie as Kim Gre­
gory added eight and Tres- 
tia Moore added seven for 
the Horns. Sheryl Waltup 
had eight for Three Way.

The Longhorn varsity 
girls had trouble with the 
tough Eaglettes and fell 
51-36.

The Elementary Library 
at Lazbuddie Schools will 
be sponsoring a Book Fair 
where children of school 
age may purchase books 
they have selected. The 
Books will be displayed by 
Education Reading Service 
and will be on display at 
the Elementary Library. 
The prices on books will 
range from 39 cents to 
S4.00 These books have 
been examined and are 
suitable for young child­
ren. They will make fine 
Christmas presents.  The 
Fair will run from Nov. 30, 
8:30 a.m. to 3:30 p.m.

The Lazbuddie Longh­
orns football advanced to 
district playoffs, Thursday 
night in Plainview’s Bull­
dog stadium where they 
met up with the Valley 
Patriots. Lazbuddie won 
their part of the zone play 
by beating Smyer last Fri­
day night. Their district 
record is unblemished at 
6-0 and the Horns are 8-2 
for the year.

The Lazbuddie FHA Cha­
pter presented a Tasty Tea 
and Style Show on Thurs­
day night, Nov. 8 in the 
school’s cafeteria. All of 

the FHA members model­
ed the newest Fall Fas ­
hion trends,  and guests at 
the function got a sampl­

ing of some new and tasty 
recipes. Proceeds from the 
style show will go > 
purchase new books for 
the Lazbuddie High School 
Library.

The members  of the Lon­
ghorn Band made a third 
division on their UIL mar­
ching show Tuesday, Nov. 
6 in Jones  Stadium, Lub 
bock. It was the first time 
the band had performed in 
UIL competition and direc­
tor Carl Wilke said he was 
“ pleased with the perfor­
mance of the band. ”  Some 
of the judges comments 
were “ nice looking band ” , 
and “ keep working it takes 
a while to build a band 
program” . There were II 
Class B and A bands that 
received a third division.

The eighth grade English 
Class and the third graders 
were both treated to a 
change in curriculum on 
Wednesday,  Nov. 14, 
when Mrs. Carolyn Black­
burn,  Library supervisor 
from region 16 Educational 
Service Center taught the 
classes about Library 
Skills. The eighth grade 
class learned the skills in 
conjunction with their En ­
glish text, but the third 
graders were hosted to a 
taste of Library science 
because they were interes­
ted in it. Mrs. Blackburn 
has consented to come 
again and go over some of 
the Library procedures 
with some of the other 
classes at a later date.

RECIPE
By Sarah Anne Sheridan

Because of their large 
amounts of starches and 
sugar, sweet potatoes yield 
about one-third more energy 
value than white potatoes.

One medium-sized deep 
yellow sweet potato will sup­
ply the normal person's daily 
need of vitamin A.

Baked Sweet Potatoes

Select potatoes of uni­
form size for baking. Wash 
and trim off ends. Grease 
skins slightly.

Put potatoes in a pan and 
bake slowly. Turn once 
during baking. Butter gen­
erously when eating.

Sweet Potato Secrets

1 c cold mashed sweet 
potatoes

1 T milk 
Salt and pepper

1 t baking powder
12 marshmallows

Fine dry bread 
crumbs

2 eggs beaten

Beat potatoes with a little 
hot milk until they are fluffy 
hut not too soft. Mix in bak­
ing powder and seasoning.

Form 2 tablespoons of 
potato mixture around each 
marshmallow. Roll in bread 
crumbs, then in egg which 
has been diluted with milk, 
then in bread crumbs.

Cook 3 minutes in hot fat. 
Drain on paper and serve at 
once with baked apple rings.

COMINQ NEXT WEEK

S i - B r a n dTacos
4 Dairi| Queen

Best Combo North of Mexico!
*En|oy three delicious Texas T Brand Tacos at tegular 

price and get an order ol tasty, tangy Ha-Cha 
Nachos FREE1

This Monday, Nov 26 
th ru  Sunday Dec 2 
only.

- - *  . 1  . .  .ocwy u  p w u c v s in y  u w u s
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is 
Tuesdays And Fridays

11:00

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1*1 Insertion, 

per word --S .11 
Minimum Charge -■ 

$1.80

2nd Insertion^ 
and thereafter 
per word -- $.09 

Minimum Charge 
$1.50

CARD OF THANKS 
25 words •• $3.00 

Over 25 words 
charged at regular 

classified rates 
Classified Display -- 

$1.55 per column inch 
Double Rate for 

Blind Ads. 
DEADLINE FOR 

INSERTION
11 a.m.  Tues . forThurs .

11 a.m . Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY, 
REVISE OR REJECT 
ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

FOR SALE: Two labors of 
land; house and 2 lots. Call 
272-3923.
8-47s-tfc

3 bedroom brick
with double garages in 
Country Club Addition.

• • • • * * • * * • • • • • • • • * • * * * •
1. PERSONALS

WE BUY
USED FURNITURE & 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
1-18s-tfc

3. HELP WANTED

H e l p  w a n t e d : Mule­
shoe Publishing Co. is now 
accepting applications for 
employment.  Must be able 
ito type 55 words per 
minute and some creative 
ability would be helpful.

Apply in person, to Polly, 
at Journal Office, 304 W. 
Second St.
3-23t-tfh«p
.......................... ..........................
EXPERIENCE John Deere 
parts personnel,  insurance 
paid, vacation, uniforms, 
sick leave. Call 257-3785 
after 6 p . m .
3-46t-tfc

OPERATOR WANTED: 
Contact Faye Montgomery 
at Patio Beauty Shop. 
Phone 272-4318.
3-42s-tfc

Immediate Opening for LV 
N or RN with established 
progressive Home Health
Age ncy. Mileage, excel­
lent benefits. Muleshoe 
area. Call 806-747-2814 for 
application, for more infor­
mation.
3-46s-4tc

HELP WANTED: House­
keeping and child care, 
Lazbuddie vicinity. Call 
anytime 965-2927 or 965- 
2922.
3-47s-2tc

WANTED: Experienced
new car salesman. Apply 
at Robert D. Green, Inc. 
2400 West American Blvd. 
Call 272-4588.
3-47t-tfc

7. WANTED TO RENT 
• * * * • • * • • • • * • • * * * • • » • • •

ROBERT RUIZ, INC. 
wants to cash lease, with 
option to buy, */» or 
section of good vegetable 
land in Bailey or Parmer 
Counties. Must have good 
wells with sufficient water. 
Contact Mr. Ruiz at 512- 
383-6236, Edinburgh,  Tx. 
or W.H.  Lee at 806-272- 
3728, M uleshoe.
7-46s-8tp

8. REAL ESTATE FOR 
SALE

HOUSE FOR SALE: By 
owner,  1922 sq. ft., 3 bed­
rooms, 2 bath, den, refrig­
erated air, fireplace, less 
than appraised price, 1733 
W. Ave. B. Call 272-4661. 
8-4 7s-tfc

bedroom-Single garage 
n 9th Street, 525,000.00

Country Home
1 year old 3 bedroom, 2
bath, fireplace, double
garage on 1 '/> acres of
land, 2 miles from town. *
Approximately 2150 sq.
ft.

5 bedroom, 3 bath 
house on corner loti 
West 10th. Ideal for 
large family or convert to 
1 apartments.

4 chair Beauty Shop for 
sale. Immediate possess­
ion. Bargain Price.

3 bedroom house in 
Lenau Addition.
$28,500.00. Immediate 
possession. Single gar­
age, fence and storm 
cellar.

4 bedroom house on Ave 
J,  $26,500.00

FARMS RANCHES HOMES

JOHN W. SMITH,
Broker

HIGHW AY 214 NORTH  

M U LESH O E. TEX A S

TOW N and
C O U N T R Y

REAL ESTATE
806-272-4678 

or 4307
8-44s-tfc_______________

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3
bedroom, 2 bath, brick, 
carpet, drapes,  carport, 
fenced backyard. 1627 W. 
Ave. C. Call 272-4794 day­
time, 272-3791 evenings 
for appointment.
8-44s-tfc

' Jb
udderth Realty, In?.

Bo« 627 - 109 5«i St t
Farwell. T e x *  79325 j

Ptuxie 18061 481 3288 or 461 9149 .

I 
I 
I 
I
u
j 160 acres North of Pro- |  
! gress, good water area, 1 |  
I  well, priced to sell, f

r --------------------- {
1 160 Acres northwest of !  
|Muleshoe,  2 wells, lays* 
|  good, on FM highway. '
h---------------------- {
I 160 Acres near Nichols! 
I Gin, 1'/: miles north of] 
|  Highway 70. Good water* 
| a r e a , lays good. *

I

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom 
home. Large livingroom 
and kitchen. Built in 
appliances. Laundry 
Room, office, Sewing 
room. Large Yard with 
water well, Brick fence, 
& large bearing pecan & 
fruit trees.  218 W. 18th. 
Shown by appointment.  
Phone 272-4860 after 6 or 
weekends.
8-39t-tfc

FOR SALE: New 3 bed­
room home in Earth, 601 
NE 5th. Under 20 percent 
down, owner financed. Ph. 
806-795-7732.
8-46s-6tp

SMALLWOOD REAL 
ESTATE 

272-4838 232 MainStreet 
Joe Smallwood & Ricky 

Smallwood

907 W . 7th, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, car port, brick, 
fe nced back yard.

New brick homes, 3 bed­
room , 2 bath.
8-43s-tfc

XAAAAAAAAMAAAMIMli
THREE LOTS for sale on 
Ivy in Country Club Ad­
dition. Call 214-572-9264 
or 214-572-5628 after 5 
p . m .
8-43t-tfc

For all your real estate needs 
Call:

GLAZE & GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-1 ls-tfc

FOR SALE: 1973 model 
Castle Mobile Home 14 x 
68. Call 965-2666.
8-46s-tfc

u u ' . i m
KREBBS 

REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
P h . 272-3191 

All Your Real Estate 
Needs.

APPRAISALS
8: lfr-tfc

T
I

HOUSE IN RICHLAND 
HILLS, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
livingroom and den, 2 car 
garage,  2124 sq. ft. Call 
272-4744.
8-38t-tfc

WE NEED YOUR FARMj 
j ^ R A N C H  LISTINGS a
1 320 Acres in Lazbuddie! 
I area, good water area . j  
I circular sprinkler, 1 milej  
J off highway. g

S - l i L 1—_ _ _ _ _ _  J
FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath stucco home, cellar 
and lots of extras,  must 
sell Call 272-4403. 
8-43t-tfc

If you have good credit and 
make $16,000 or less you 
can qualify for a FmHa 
approved home. In most 
cases no down payment ,  
only loan closing cost 
requied.

Call J & R Construction, 
your National Home
Builders.
272-3758 or 272-4347 
8-31 s-tfc

FOR SALE: Buildings to 
be moved, formerly Bill’s 
Drive-In on Hwy. 84. Con­
tact Lewis Garnett,  799- 
5550 or at night 799-6265. 
8-46s-3tp

100 Acres with 10 inch 
well.

160 acres, 1 well, 
Valley water driven
circular sprinkler.

39 1/2 Acres all in cult 
ivation - 1 - six inch well 
29 percent down.

2/3 acre with Mobile 
home, rent house.

158 A 2 wells.

78 TRANS AM..Beautiful,  
fully loaded, high perfect. 
Big radio and speakers 
$500 below book $6400. 
Portales 505-356-4006. 
9-46s-4tp

FOR SALE: One pickup- 
camper shell, like new, 
excellent shape.  Call 272- 
4545.
9-47t-4tc

77 4x4 GMC BLAZER.. 
18,000 miles, loaded. Per­
fect condition $6750. Port- 
ales 505-356-4006.
9-46s-4tp

FOR SALE: 1973 Mercury, 
good condition. Call 272- 
4679 or see at 201 W . 10th.
9- 47s-2tsc

10. FARM EQUIP. FOR 
SALE

FOR SALE: Model 33 J.D. 
cotton stripper. 24-A Hess- 
ton stripper,  basket model, 
fits J .D.  4010 - 4020. Call 
946-3679.
10- 42s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1 new 6 row 
Lilliston Roll cultivator 
with burning off discs. 1 
new Wylie Spray Rig, 8 
row with 400 gallon poly 
tank, 1 Green gear head - 
75 HP, 1 lot of stand pipes. 
Call 825-3822.
10-4 7t-tfc

FOR SALE: 1963 Chevro­
let Burr truck. Fab-steel 
five auger bed. Call 965- 
2768.
10-46t-tfc

11. FOR SALE OR TRADE
* * • • • • • » t  *»* » ** ********

FOR SALE: Honda On-off 
Road Bike, 1972 SL 350. 
good motor-500 miles ince 
overhaul. Good condition. 
Call 272-4793.
11 -40s-tfc

12 HOUSEHOLE ITEMS

BURROWS
UPHOLSTERY & FURNI­

TURE REPAIR
118 W. Ave. C 

in the rear.
Phone 272-4255 
12-39s-tfc

15. MISCELLANEOUS

ONE used Gifford Hill side 
roll, used and new center 
pivots and siderolls for
sale.
WESTERN SPRINKLERS, 
INC. 272-4544.
15-47t-4tc

FRESH HONEY for sale, 
with or without comb. Nick 
Landers,  334 W. Ave. J.,  
Muleshoe. Phone 272-3096
15-44s-tfc

5 A. nice improvement 29 
percent down.

Approximately 26 acres 29 
percent down.

We want your business 
“ remember”
REID REAL ESTATE 
THUR$IE 272-3142 

REID or

Lucille Harp 272-4693 

8-43s-stfc

MULESHOE HOME 
CENTER, INC. 

Has Custom made 
Fireplaces.

105 E. Ave. B. 
Call 272-5105 

15-47s-stfc

* • •* •* • • • • •* * * * « * • •* • • •
9. AUTOMOBILES FOR 
SALE

FOR SALE: 1974 Cadillac 
El Dorado, loaded. $2,400 
or best offer. Call 272-4220 
or 272-4281. After 5 p.m.,  
272-4388.
9-47t-4tc

DIESEL CARS. .2 new 
1979 Olds Delta 88, 4 door, 
loaded, $9150. 98 Reg­
ency, 2 door, fully loaded, 
$11,950. Call Portales 505- 
356-4006.
9-46s-4tp

CUSTOM HOME - 
ADD ON - 

REMODELING 
CALL

J & R CONSTRUCTION 
272-3758 

OR
272-4347 

15-14t-tfc

Muleshoe Home 
Center Inc. 
105 E. Ave. B 

272-5105
Has Custom M ade 

STORM WINDOWS 
AND

STORM DOORS
15-47s-stfc

Card Of 
Thanks

We would like to thank 
everyone for making our 
Thanksgiving supper a 
wonderful success. We a p ­
preciate each and every­
one of you. God bless you 
all.

The Needmore Club 
Ladies

15-47s-ltc

Card Of 
Thanks

The family of T.O. Cha­
ney would like to express 
their sincere appreciation 
to all the people who were 
considerate and thoughtful 
following his death recent­
ly-

Your acts of kindness in 
visits, flowers, cards,  food 
and telephone calls were 
appreciated by all the fam­
ily. May God’s richest 
blessings be extended to 
each of you.
Sheriff and Mrs. Dee 
Clements
Alton & Herbert  Chaney 
Charlene Johnson & 
LaQueta Garner 
Mrs. Dora Chaney 
Mae Chambers  
W .E. Chaney 
15-47s-ltc

WANTED: One irrigated 
wheat field, 100 acres or 
more with large chicken 
house or large barn. Will 
pay a premium. Call 915- 
459-2215.
15-46s-6tc

NOW REFINISHING FUR­
NITURE, Antiquing, stain­
ing, or painting. Sherry 
Stevenson and Betty Car­
penter.  Phone 272-4902 or 
272-4686.
15-47t-8tp

LET US figure your new 
home or remodel your 
present one. Cabinet and 
finish work our specialty. 
References. Ph. 927-5320 
or 797-8400.
15-45s-8tp

FOR SALE: Mobile home 
double wide 64 x 24, 3 
bedroom, 2 full baths 18 ft. 
off set Miller, 7 row JD 
lister, 8 71 Flex plantes. 
Call 965- 2453.
15-46t-4tc

CERM AIC TILE 
Floors, baths,  showers 
repairs. Free estimates 

MULESHOE HOME 
CENTER. INC.
105 E. Ave. B 

272-5105 
15-47s-stfc

WANTED TO BUY OR 
TRADE FOR: 30 HP verti­
cal Electric motor and 
control box, 480 Amp.,  
Call 806-257-3701.
15-47 t-2tc

PYROTHERM
INSULATION

Guaranteed for life of 
structure

FREE ESTIMATE

Marvin or George 
N iem an

272-5564 or 965-2488 
15-29s-tfc

ASPHALT ROOFING 
COMPOSITION 

SHINGLES 
new roof and repairs. 

Free Estimates.
Call Collect 
Ron Foshee 

385-5680
LITTLEFIELD ROOFING

15-16s-tfc

ELLCTRICAL WORK: Reason 
able rates, jobs large or small. 
Jerry Teaff Electric.
Phone 933-4659, Bula
15 3D-tfc

'< •4 1  • a • • -a a  ., . aa.-~a - a a p a k a a /

Are You Ready For 
W inter?

Call RICK'S Insulation 
And We ' l lGet  You 

Ready
FREE ESTIMATES 

Rick Claybrook 
272-3159 or 272-4818 
lS-40s-tfc

Three Way 
News

By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

Sowder home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. A.G. Taylor 
from Muleshoe were din­
ner guests in the Joe

Public Notice
NOTICE TO ALL PER­
SONS HAVING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE ESTATE 
OF LAURA ODESSA SLA- 
YDEN, DECEASED 

Notice is hereby given 
that original letters tes t a­
mentary upon the Estate of 
Laura Odessa Slayden, De­
ceased,  have been issued 
to me, the undersigned,  on 
the 21st day of November 
1979, in the proceeding 
indicated below my s igna­
ture hereto, which is still 
pending and that I now 
hold such letter. All pe r­
sons having claims against 
said estate,  which is being 
administered in the Co­
unty below named, are 
hereby required to present 
the same to me at the 
address below given, be ­
fore suit upon the same are 
barred by the general s ta­
tute of limitations, before 
such estate is closed, and 
within the time prescribed 
by law. My post office 
address is 905 North W as­
hington, Victoria, Texas 
77901.

Dated this the 21st day of 
November,  1979.
(s)Elmer C . Slayden 
Elmer Slayden, Executor 
of the Estate of Laura Od­
essa Slayden, Deceased,  
No. 1355, in the County 
Court of Bailey County, 
Texas.
15-47s-ltp

Card Of Thanks
Words are inadequate to 

express our feelings of 
thanks for our many fri­
ends who were so loving 
and concerned for us dur­
ing the loss of our Mother 
and Grandmother.  We 
greatly appreciate the me­
morials, food, cards, flo­
wers,  calls and visits. We 
want to give a special 
thanks to the Nurses and 
Nurses Aids at the Mule­
shoe Nursing Home. May 
God Bless each of you. 
The Family of Mattie Glas­
scock 
15-47s-ltc

Mrs.  S.G. Long, was in 
Lubbock to attend the Eas­
tern Star workshop.

Mr. arid Mrs. H.C. 
Toombs, and Bulah Toom­
bs, were supper guests in 
Muleshoe Sunday evening 
with the Gary Toombs.

• • *  * •

The Three Way basket ­
ball girls played, Lazbud­
die, Tuesday night at Laz­
buddie with both Three 
Way girls winning. Friday 
night Three Way basket ­
ball girls and boys played 
Sudan at Sudan loosing 
both games.

Barbara Smith, under­
went surgery, in Metho­
dist hospital, in Lubbock 
M onday.

MINI-HACK " SAW
A small tool for big jobs 
in sm all places Uses 
regular blades or broken 
pieces Durable molded 
fram e w ith  contoured 
handle. 15-210

Quantities Limited

Farmers in the commun­
ity are very busy pulling 
cotton. The gins in the 
community are very crow­
ded.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tyson, were in Lubbock, 
Thursday night, on busi ­
ness.

W.L. Welch was a medi­
cal patient in a Littlefield 
hospital, last week.

* • • • *
The Enoch Methodist had 

their third Sunday dinner 
last Sunday with Rev. Ma­
rvin Gregory from Morton 
bringing the message after 
noon.

There is but one way for a 
newspaper man to look 
at a politician and that 
is down.

•Frank H. Simonde.

Ph. 272-4511 
401 S. 1st 
Muleshoe,

, , 4UI J . 1st
♦ Muleshoe, Texas X
4 ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ «

Lionel Lane reports.

Bailey Co. 
Results $  2

Again this year Pioneer® brand seeds are delivering 
outstanding yields in field after field. But we know it 
takes more than one year's performance to tell the 
whole story. Look at these results, then ask your Pio­
neer dealer to show you records from several years. 
You'll see for yourself why Pioneer brand seeds have 
become famous for their consistency.

This outs tanding corn hybrid produced top yields 
throughout Bailey County this year. Gene McGuire 
recorded a yield of 10,511 lbs ./A  in the Muleshoe 
area.  Gene Paul Jarmon also reported excellent 
performance from 3311 with exceptional yield of 
13.438 lbs ./A .  In 37 tests in this area,  3311 averaged 
10,810 lb s . /A .  with 611 lb s . /A .  yield advantage over 
the  neares t competitor.  3311 has shown excellent 
drouth tolerance and will adjust  kernel  depth to 
match growing conditions. Because it silks earlier 
than 3195, this hybrid can help you spread  weather 
risks when planted as field companion to 3195.

Thirty two hybrid comparison  tests in this area 
proved again that 3195 is a truly outs tanding corn 
hybrid. 3195 averaged 10,836 lbs ,/A .  in these  

on-farm tests. R.J . Garner,  who farms near Lariat 
recorded a yield of 12.043 lb s . /A .  And even with 
la te-season hail. J .R .  Johnson of Muleshoe reported 
11.078 lb s . /A .  with 3195. One of the  most popular 
hybrids ever introduced in this area.  3195 proved its 
consis tency, outs tanding disease tolerance and good 
standabili ty  again this year. And i t ‘s sure to be a 
favorite again in *80.

Order by December 15 
Get this wallet FREE!

f i n a n c e
Year After Year It's...

P IO N E E R
brand

S E E D S

The Limitation of Warranty and remedy appearing on the label 
is part of the terms of sale

’ Registered irademark of Pioneer Hi Bred International Iru 
............................ .. Pioneer is a brand name numbers identify varieties J



, 
-★

★
★

★
★

★
★

★
★

★
★

★
★

★
★

*
★

★
★

*
*

*
*

*
★

★
*

*
*

*
★

*
*

*
*

★
*

★
*

*
★

★
*

★
★

*
*

★
★

*
★

*
★

*
*

★
*

*
*

★
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

*
*

'*
*

Page 10, Bailey County Journal, Sunday, Nov. 25, 1979

W E  R E S E R V E  T H E  R IG H T  T O  L IM IT  

PRICES EFFECTIVE NOVEMBER 25-DECEMBER 1.1S7S

\f  KRAFT 
IlMIRACLE WHIP SALAO l

Dressing
Miracle

W h i p .
S«iad O'****

MORTON'S
FROZEN
HONEY

BUNS
9 OZ. 
BOXES

W IT H  $ 7  5 0  O R  M O R E  P U R C H A S E  
E X C L U D IN G  C IG A R E T T E S AVAILABLE 

AT SPECIAL 
SAVDI6S TO YOB

SUPER SELECT FRESH QUARTER PORK 
LOINS OR FAMILY PACK 8-11 ASSTD. CHOPS

PORK
CHOPS YOUR CHOICE

BROCCOLI C H O P P E I

CORNsr* 
VEGETABLES

1 0  O Z  
B O X

IR M E L 'S  S U P E R  S E L E C T S ,  
F R E S H  P O R K  S P A R E FISH STICKS^

Q S I U n i  C Q  K R A F T -A M E R IC A N -  
y l l S U L h y  P IM IE N T O - S W IS S  .

CHEEZ WHIZ J A L A P E

R IQ P I 111 it  P IL L S B U R Y C O U N I  
D l U W U I  I  W  S T Y L E  O R  B U T T E R

Peyton
Slab Bacon

RIBS ^
99 *_______

PORK STEAK; 
PORK ROAST 
SPARE RIBS; 
PORK CHOPS

HOT LINKS
SIZZLEANit
FRANKS;;?
BOLOGNA

M E X IC A N  S T Y L E  
G L O V E R ' S .............

O Z
C A N S

L E A N  T R IM  
C E N T E R  C U T

NEW CROP! FLORIDA

ORANGES
POTATOES
CARROTS;
CABBAGES

A L L  P U R P O S E  
R U S S E T .............

SOFT-N-PRETTY
BATHROOM

TISSUE
P J 1 5 *  OFF LABEL FOAMY

m  S h a v e  
4  C r e a m  6ca°nz

n D I  H I  B O D E N 'S  O R A N G I 
1 1 «  I X  R IC H -N  R E A D Y

P U I I  I R A N C H  S T Y L E  
W I I I  L i  I  P L A IN

SPAM S P R E A D 1

ORANGES use 
SOUP MIX
X P  A  S H U R F IN E

I  IN S T A N T  ..............................................

P |  P | | D  G L A D IO L A  
■ k  W  W  E N R IC H E D

PUREX%  
DOBIE PADS

15* OFF LABEL BRONZE

R i g h t
G u a r d
FOR SINUS HEADACHES

*SII\IE 
*AID 24 CT 

BOX

N O N  A B R A S IV E  
S C O U R IN G COLD MEDICINE FOR CHILDREN

CONTAC S 
JR .

Store Hours; .. 
O ften  8 :0 0 .1 0 :0 0 ; 

Monday - Saturday 

Sunday 9:0041:00

We Welcome 
USDA Food 

Stamp Coupons
”  C A M E O  C O P P F R  O R  

* * »  ■ S '; A IN l E S S S I E E L

*  PADS K U R L Y  K A T E  S C O U R IN G  P A D S  
2 C T  S T E E L  O R  3 C T  B R A S S

♦Morton Donut Shop 
4 honey bum

AMERICAN BEAUTY

S H E L L "  
RON I 10 OZ. 

PKGS

DETERGENT

JGIAN T
-C H EER

RIGHT
GUARD

!■ ?*>!
R I G H T

GUARD

t


