
»«AN
TtJ

' aJ
* A ffn on . ij

R„ĵ
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graduating class of Crowell 
High School. Salutatorian is 
Jacquelyn Brown, with a 
grade average of 95.00.

Other honor students 
(those with an average of 90 
or above) as listed by the 
principal, arc Rita Black 
Hinkle. 93.81; Ruth Stone. 
93.5.1; Allen Tapp. 91.50; 
April Werley. 90.57; Rita 
Hodges. 90.08; and Karen 
Statser. 90.00.

Wall added that 
baccalaureate sers’ices will 
be held on Sunday, May 18, 
an d  c o m m e n c e m e n t  
exercises are set for Friday, 
Mav 23.

Perform at 
Vernon

The Crowell High School 
Wildcat Band, directed by 
Jam es Streit, will be 
participating in the opening 
day parade of the Santa Rosa 
Roundup next Wednesday 
afterniKtn in Vernon.

Members of the band will 
be attending the opening 
night performance of the 
rodeo Wednesday, with free 
tickets furnished by the 
Roundup. Mr. Streit added.

Band members will be 
wearing the new uniforms 
purchased recently by the 
Band Btntsters and the school 
district. The new uniforms 
arrived here about two weeks 
ago. Band members were 
attired in their new' uniforms 
when they participated in the 
UIL concert and sight 
reading contests in Vernon 
Wednesday of last week.

TWO NEW VEHICLES
Two new vehicles were 

registered here last week: 
April 14. Thomas L. 
Tamplen. 1975 Chevrolet 
pickup; April 14, Woodrow 
Lucas. 1975 Chevrolet slake 
truck.

Child abuse often occurs 
during times of crisis when a 
parent is angry and upset, 
Mrs. Ilcnc Miller, with the 
Extension Service, points 
out.

ASCS Lists
Conservation
Practices

The Foard County ASCS 
office has been authorized to 
accept requests for two soil 
conservation practices.

They are sprigging 
bermudagrass or seeding 
perennial grasses on crop­
land subject to erosion, and 
shaping and seeding water­
ways or other water runoff 
control measures.

The local office also 
announced that no brush 
control practices have been 
approved up to last week.

Gummed kraft tape for 
wrapping packages.—Only 
29c at the Newsoffice.

Anniversaries Coming 
luring Next Few Days

Iversaries note- 
nention for this 

Coming up within 
days.

My. April 27,

Foard County will be 84 
years old. It was back on 
April 27. 1891, that an Act of 
the Texas Legislature 
created Foard County and
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Gentry was re-elected 
president; Donald Werley is 
the new vice president; Mrs. 
Ward Kuehn is secretary; J .  
E. Brasher was re-elected 
treasurer, and Bill Klepper is 
reporter.

Next meeting of the band 
boosters was set for the third 
Monday night in August.

TO SERVE LUNCH
The ladies auxiliary of the 

Free Will Baptist Church will 
serve lunch Friday, April 25, 
from 11:30 until 1:30 at the 
church. Everyone is invited 
to attend. Proceeds will go to 
various church projects.

Plenty of Swingline and
B o s t ic h  s t a p le s .  — Foard
County News.

[ps Set Annual 
lings Saturday

[Cooperatives 
their annual 

lis week end. 
April 25, 

o’clock, the 
I Society No. 1 
knual meeting

Cooperative 
will have its 

tg Saturday 
|l 26, starting

at 1 o’clock at the gin office.
On Saturday afternoon, 

April 26, at the Truscott 
community center, the 
members of the Farmers 
C o o p e r a t i v e  E l e v a t o r  
Association of Troscott will 
be having their annual 
meeting.

At 4 o’clock that same 
afternoon, the Farmers 
Cooperative Gin of Gilliland 
will have its annual meeting 
at the Gilliland school house.

Hopkins
Died

Earl O. Hopkins. 73, of 
Fort Worth and former Foard 
County resident, died last 
Thursday in a Fort Worth 
hospital.

Funeral services were held 
at 3 p.m. Saturday, April 19, 
at tl\e Thalia Church of 
Christ conducted by Minister 
D. L. Crafton and Bill 
Marlow of Crowell.

Interment was in the 
Thalia Cemetery with 
Womack Funeral Home in 
charge. Nephews were 
bearers.

Mr. Hopkins was born July 
6, 1901, in Waxahachie. A 
resident of Rayland for about 
four years, he was married to 
the former Jewel Bean in 
Dayton, Ark.

He is survived by his wife; 
one son. Harley Hopkins of 
Fort Worth; one daughter, 
Mrs. Gerald LeHue of 
Wichita Falls; four brothers. 
Dumas Hopkins of Crowell, 
Freeman Hopkins of Thalia. 
Thad Hopkins of Vernon, and 
Glen Hopkins of Clinton. 
Ok.; one s ister ,  Mrs. 
Leonard Tole of Crowell.

Band Wins Again!
Track Boys 
Qualify for

Three Crowell High School 
track boys qualified for the 
regional meet in Lubbock 
this week end as a result of 
their performances in the 
district meet at Abilene last 
weekend.

David Bell won first in the 
120 high hurdles and second 
in the discus. Melvin 
Westover won second in the 
shot while Randy Prince won 
second in the mile run. First 
and second place winners at 
the district meet qualify for 
the regional meet.

Printiss Gidney is coach of 
the varsity boys track team.

named it after an officer who 
served in the Civil War.

Thirty-three years ago on 
Monday, April 28, a tornado 
struck Crowell, demolishing 
many residences and part of 
the business section, in 
addition to claiming 11 lives 
and injuring hundreds.

Bank Deposits 
Up Nearly 
$400,000

Deposits in the Crowell 
State Bank were up almost 
$400,000 from a year ago 
following figures released 
after a call Friday of last 
week by state and federal 
authorities for the condition 
of all banks as of the close of 
business April 18.

Deposits in the local bank 
April 16. 1975, were
$7,466,821.47 while a year 
ago, April 24, 1974, they 
totaled $7.074,354.93.

Deposits this April are up 
almost $2'/j million, as the 
statement of condition on 
March 28, 1973, listed 
deposits of $5 ,036 ,328 .64 . 
Three years ago— April 18, 
1972, deposits were 
$4 ,732 .859 .59 . and four 
years ago, April 20, 1971, 
deposits were $4,953,225.49.

Wheat
Acreage Must 
Be Certified

The Foard County ASCS 
office has been advised that 
in order for wheat producers 
to be able to prove a wheat 
yield, the producer must 
certify his acreage by May 1.

Mrs. Thelma Borchardt of 
the ASCS office, says, " I f  
you plan to prove your yield 

in future years, be sure this 
office has a record of your 
acreage.”

Foard County has been 
receiving some typical spring 
weather this past week. High 
west winds last Friday kicked 
up a terrific dust storm

It’s Spring 
Tim e at 
State Park

Copper Breaks State Park 
8 miles north of Crowell, is in 
all its spring beauty at the 
present time. with 
approximately 25 varieties of 
wild flowers in bloom. The 
most prolific one is the milk 
vetch, commonly known as 
buffalo peas. This particular 
wild flower carpets a large 
part of the park as well as 
surrounding pastures and 
roadsides, permeating the 
air with a fresh sweet aroma. 
The milk vetch thrives on gyp 
land.

Park Supt. Bob Matin says 
a nature trail is b e in g ,  
constructed so that plants, 
geological formations,
animals, reptiles and other 
forms of wildlife may be 
observed in their natural 
setting.

The dam for the new lake 
lacks only about 2 weeks 
more construction work and 
will be finished as soon as 
the contractor returns to the 
park. Mr. Martin said that 
the stocking date for the lake 
has been set for June 1.

One of the loveliest views 
of the Pease River, the north 
part of Foard County and 
Crowell water tower is visible 
from the Scenic Overlook on 
the south side of the park.

Mr. Martin invites every­
one to visit the park, and 
especially the residents of 
Foard and Hardeman 
Counties.

CHS Students 
Named to
Society

New Home
Construction work on a 

new 3-bedroom brick home 
for Mr. and M rs. Seth 
Halbert and son. Konrad, 
has been started at the 
comer of Fifth and Donnel 
Streets in the northeast part 
of Crowell.

Foard County Lumber Co. 
is contractor for the new 
residence which will have 
two baths and an attached 
carport. The residence will 
face west on Fifth Street and 
is located just west of the 
residence of Mr. and Mrs. R. 
J .  Owens.

Four students from 
Crowell High School have 
been named to the Society of 
Distinguished American 
High School Students, 
according to an announce­
ment made last Friday by 
Principal L. H. Wall.

The four students named 
are Mary Quintero and 

- Ja c q u e ly n  Brown, both 
seniors, and Rocky Glasscock 
and Stephen Stapp, juniors.

These students are now 
participating in The Society 
of Distinguished American 
High School Student’s 
Annual Awards Program 
which offers approximately 
$800.000 in college scholar­
ships over a four year college 
tenure. The scholarships 
consist of unrestricted merit 
awards and renewable 
annual scholarships to lead­
ing colleges and universities 
across the nation. The 
Society 's  National Awards 
Program is the largest of its 
kind in the country.

Principals and counselors 
of high schools submit to The 
Society each year a limited 
number of their top students. 
The Society then honors only 
these young men and women 
who have distinguished 
themselves as the highest of 
achievers.

Band to Enter 
Contest in 
Amarillo

The Crowell High School 
Band, under the direction of 
Ja m e s  Streit,  will spend 
Friday, April 25, in Amarillo 
participating in the Greater 
Southwest Music Festival.

Crowell’s performance in 
the contest will be at 3 p.m. 
that afternoon, Mr. Streit 
said. Band members will 
return to Crowell Friday 
night.

MRS GAFFORD

Hospital Adminstrator 
to Retire June 1

County Receives Dust 
Storm Last Friday

across this section, and the 
norther following dropped 
the mercury to the 30's early 
Saturday morning.

Tuesday was cloudy with 
prospects of rain. The county 
is in need of a good general 
rain.

Most of the county’s wheat 
is not Kx»king as good as it 
did earlier in the season and 
speculation runs the gamut 
as to the reason, ranging 
from rust to dry weather to 
reverse results from the late 
freeze.

Mrs. Bettie K. Gafford, 
Registered Nurse, has 
announced that she will 
resign as administrator of the 
Foard County Hospital 
effective Sunday, June 1. 
She has been a resident of 
Foard County for almost 
thirty years and has been 
connected with the local 
hospital as either co- 
administrator or administra­
tor since 1957.

Mrs. Gafford was born in

School to 
Be Out 
Next Wed.

Crowell’s schools will be 
dismissed next Wednesday, 
April 30. This will be the 
opening day of the Santa 
Rosa Roundup in Vernon.

In addition to a parade 
performance by the CHS 
aw ard -w in n in g  W ild ca t  
Band, a number of local 
young people are expected to 
be riding with the Crowell 
Riding Club in the parade.

ASCS Extends 
Final Date

The final date to release, 
request reapportioned acres 
or transfer 1975 cotton 
allotments has been 
extended to May 1.

This announcement was 
made last week by the Foard 
Countv ASCS office.

Harmon County. Ok., the 
daughter of the late Jobe and 
Louisa Keesee. She is a 1939 
graduate of the West Texas 
Hospital School of Nursing in 
Amarillo.

In September 1939 she 
accepted a position as 
Director of Nursing in the 
Vernon Hospital. On June 2. 
1943, she married Bill 
Gafford of Crowell. Mrs. 
Gafford remained in her 
nursing profession in Vernon 
until her husband returned 
from two years service 
during World War 11.

On September 1, 1945, the 
couple moved to Crowell. 
Mrs. Gafford did private 
duty nursing and did relief 
for the hospital administra­
tors until October 1, 1957. At 
that time, she and Mrs. 
Edith Roark accepted the 
position as co-administrators 
of Foard County Hospital. 
Mrs. Roark left her position 
after approximately two 
years. After Mrs. Roark left 
her position, Mrs. Gafford 
accepted the full responsi­
bility of administrative 
duties.

Mrs. Gafford is a member 
of the American Nurses 
Association, Texas Nurses 
Association and she has been 
listed in Who’s Who of 
American Women. She is a 
member of the Church of 
Christ.

In announcing her forth­
coming retirement. Mrs. 
Gafford expressed her 
appreciation for the coopera­
tion she has received from 
the commissioners court, 
hospital board, doctors and 
all the hospital staff during 
her years as administrator of 
the local hospital.

"Fine band, good training.
I bet y’all are proud to be 
from Crowell. Thanks.' 
congrats. Keep working tor a 
better band.”

" T h is  one is certainly 
outstanding.
Congratulations! GiHid
luck!"

"V ery  good band .My 
pleasure to hear you. A 
credit to your school, 
yourselves and your com­
munity!"

"What a way to end 3 days 
of contest. All of you and 
your director have made 
beautiful music together 
today. Congratulations!"

These are some of the 
comments of the judges 
made last Wednesday after­
noon in Vernon after Crowell 
High School's Wildcat Band, 
directed by James Streit. and 
decked out in their new 
uniforms, had presented 
their numbers in the concert 
and sight reading contests. 
All of the judges gave the 
Crowell band Division 1 
ratings in both categories, 
w hile one judge gave a I -*■ 
rating for the band's 
performance in sight read­
ing.

The two division 1 ratings 
received at Vernon qualified 
the local band for a special 
award plaque. The division II 
rating received in the 
marching contest last fall 
kept the Crowell band from 
repeating this year as a 
sweep-stakes winner.

The band's three numbers 
presented in the concert 
were "Home Town Boy," 
"Symphonic Overture," and 
"Chant and Juhilo."

A number of Crowell fans 
were on hand in Vernon last 
week to hear the Wildcat 
Band give another of its 
outstanding performances 
under the direction of Mr. 
Streit.

Qualifies 
for state

Carolyn Sparkman. CHS 
senior, qualified for the state 
meet last weekend when she 
won second place in the 
60-yard dash at the girls 
regional meet in Lubbock. 
The state meet in Austin is 
set for May 2 and 3.

The 440-yard relay team 
from Crowell entered in the 
regional meet won third and 
was composed of Carolyn, 
Kathy Whitfield. Darlene 
Tucker and Kim Norman. 
Whitfield also won third in 
the broad jump. Also 
participating in the regional 
meet was Sally Gerhardt. 
who was entered in the girls 
tennis singles.

Randall Ryan is coach of 
the girls track team.

SREAKEN AT RCAO M E E T IN Q -M ario n
Porter of the Soil Conaervetlon Service et 
Terrell, Is pictured above as he addraasea 
a meeting of the annual Four Winds RC&O 
banquet held here Tuesday night of last

weak. On the right Is Von Klaibrink of the 
RC&O, and to M r Porter's right is Henry 
Black of Crowell, who is president of the 
local group and served as master of 
ceremonies for the benquet last week

■ '«•'V
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hi|{h individual in the area 
land jud({ing contest at 
Tarleton.

Editor Jacquel>n Bronn 
T>pisi Karen Stalaer
Senior Reporter Rita Hodges 
Jr. Reporter Amie Brasher 
Soph. Reporter Jill M)era 
Freshman Rep. John Klepper 
Sponsor Mrs. Jean Halbert

SCHEDULE
Thursdv—VRJC assembly 

at 10.
Friday— Amarillo band

contest, regional track meet.
Monday — Seniors go to 

Vernon.
T uesdax— Pictures

DAILY DILLIES
Congratulations to Randy 

Prince, David Bell and 
McKin Westover for winning 
at the district track meet. 
These bovs will now go to the 
regional track meet at 
Lubbivk this Friday. Randy- 
won in the mile run, David 
the hurdles and discus and 
Melvin in Shotput. Congrat­
ulations! (and giHvd luck.)

Also congratulations go to 
Carolyn Sparkman who won 
in the t>0 yard dash at 
regional and now advances to 
state. GiHvd luck!

Yearbvwks are now being 
sold at Crowell High Schixvl, 
and if you want one you 
better be sure and get your 
money in ’cause the last day 
is Mav 1. Those you can 
order from are Steve Setliff. 
April Werley. Rita Hodges 
Mary Ann Oumtero, Paul 
Whitlev, John Klepper and 
Karen Statser. You ought to 
be able to pin one of these 
down so hurry up before it's 
tiHi late! They just cost Sb.'b. 
so buy now and be happy- 
later.

Jacquelyn Brown is in 
Washington this week as a 
result of her winning the 
Texas Betty CriKker award. 
She is accompanied by Mrs. 
Mary- Brown.

Congratulations to Allen 
Tapp for being named the

SENIOR NEWS
April Werley went to 

Lubbtx'k Saturday to partici­
pate in the regional ready 
writing event.

Congratulations to Allen 
Tapp for being named the 
high individual in the area 
land judging contest at 
Tarleton.

Also, congratulations to 
Carolyn Sparkman and 
Randy Prince. Carolyn will 
represent this region in the 
bO yard dash at the state 
competition in Austin. Randy 
advances to regional in the 
mile run. This contest is this 
week end in Lubbix'k and the 
state contest is May 2 and 3.

Jacquelyn Brown is in 
Washington this week as a 
result of her winning the 
Texas Betty Crocker award. 
She is accompanied by Mrs. 
Mary Brown.

Monday the seniors will go 
to Vernon Regional Junior 
College to participate in the 
career day activities.

With the arrival of the 
caps, gowns and invitations, 
everyone is waiting anxiously 
for the end of school.
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and Lucky Westover. Thev 
both qualify for regional in 
track at Lubbock. Good luck, 
bovs!

SOPHOMORE STARS
We have several officers in 

FHA for next year. They are; 
Debra Daniel, secretary: 
Chris Thompson, 4th Vice 
President; Jana  Glover, 
Treasurer: Jil l  Myers,
historian.

Kathy Whitfield, a 
member of the sprint relay 
went to the regional track 
meet held in Lubbock. 
Friday.

Daniel Fields, Tommy 
Tamplen, Rocky Marlow-, 
Willie Bachman and Norman 
Hoppier went to the district 
track meet in Abilene. 
Friday. Good luck everyone.

We would like to con­
gratulate Mollye Wisdom for 
winning 4th in Ready- 
Writing at the UlL Literary 
Events.

JUNIOR JIVE
There is nothing like 

starting off the day with a 
first period algebra class...- 
digging into the principles of 
division, finding ctH’fficients 
of X .  or writing convenient 
notations.

Interested students Kxik 
blankly at the board while 
polynomials encircle them. 
To the students, the teacher 
is a kind of mad scientist who 
goes insane at the sign of 2x 
squared. While he is 
tangling with irrational 
numbers, students are busy- 
undertaking chores such as 
smearing on lip gloss, biting 
f in g e r n a i ls ,  s h a rp e n in g  
pens, smiling and gossiping, 
and some even try to Imik as 
if they understand it.

Altough 99% of the class 
doesn't know what is going 
on. there is always a class 
brain...the mild mannered 
"Clark Kent,” who turns 
into "Super Math.” While 
the rest of the students 
doodle on their papers trying 
to figure out just what was 
said all period, ‘ ‘Super 
Math” finishes with time to 
spare. This causes the rest of 
the class to start arranging 
for a brain transplant.

Congratulations are in 
order for juniors David Bell

FRESHMAN FROLICS
Last Wednesday- the band 

went to Vernon. They 
received two Division 1 
ratings in Concert and 
Sightreading. Band uniforms 
arrived Wednesday- so the 
band lixiked pretty snappy, 
tixi. A few weeks ago drum 
major tryouts were held. 
Head drum major for '75-76 
will be Paul Whitley.

Friday the boys track left 
for Abilene w here the district 
track meet w as held, also the 
girls who qualified for 
Regional went to Lubbivk.'

COW POKES By Ace Reid

"I shore don't see why somebody ain't invented 
a waterproof Bull Durham sacki"

WE HOPE YOU ENJOY THESE ACE REED CARTOONS EACH W EEK.

SlnaaiBi Btowa.
Member F. D. I. C. 

Crowell, Tex.

News from...

T ruscott
Gilliland
Renee Westbrook

County
History
Week

Mrs. Bill Rake of Graham 
visited friends here this 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. Ottis Cash of 
Knox City visited Saturday- 
w-ith Mrs. J .  C. Black.

Ruth Brown of Lubbock 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Jackie 
Brown and family over the 
weekend.

Jacquelyn Brow n and Mrs. 
Ray Brown of Crowell left 
Saturday afternoon for the 
National Betty Crocker 
Contest in Washington, D.C. 
They went to Wichita Falls 
and caught an airplane to 
Washington. In Wichita Falls 
they met the Oklahoma 
winner, Vickie Hickerson of 
Gould and all went to 
Washington together.

Billy- Brown and Michael 
Daniel attended a track meet 
in Abilene Friday.

Michael Daniel was 
elected secretary and 
Bernadette Greening vice 
president at the Student 
Council elections Tuesday.

Mrs. Valerie Kinnibrugh 
and children of Flovdada

CAFETERIA MENU 
APRIL 28-MAY 2 

Monday
Fish sticks, blackeyed 

peas, creamed potatoes, 
cabbage slaw, cornbread, 
milk. Graham cracker and 
peanut butter filling, fruit.

T uesday
Hamburger pizza and 
cheese, tossed salad, green 
beans, jello with fruit, milk.

Wednesday
Chicken patties, cream 
gravy, english peas, celery 
sticks, rolls, peanut butter 
cake. milk.

Thursday
Hamburger patties in 

gravy, white beans, spinach, 
carrot sticks, cornbread. 
applesauce cake, milk.

F riday
H a m b u rg e rs ,  le t t u c e ,  

onions and pickle slices, 
french fries, peanut butter 
and crackers, apple cobbler, 
milk.

SENIOR SPOTLIGHT
Ruth Stone is in the 

spotlight this week. She is 
the 18 year old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Louis Stone. 
Ruth stands 5' 5 "  and has 
green eyes and brown hair.

Ruth is a very active 
member of the First Baptist 
church here in Crowell.

Some of her favorites 
include: Fixxl. pizza; Color, 
green; Song group. Statler 
Brothers; Actor. Freddie 
Prinze. Jack Albertson.

As hobbies. Ruth enjoys 
sewing, reading, playing the 
piano. Her favorite subject is 
Consumer Education.

Ruth has many activities 
that she enjoyed throughout 
her four years in high school 
She was freshman class 
president. Spirit Queen, 
member of FHA 4 years. 
Junior Doll, 4-H member 8 
years, and secretary- of the 
4-H county- council. She was 
FHA historian her sopho­
more year, and FHA

Page 2 
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April 27 through May 3 
has been proclaimed by Gov. 
Dolph Briscoe as Ci^nty 
History Appreciation Week 
in Foard County and across 
the State.

Foard County na* 
benefitted from having an 
active Historical Survey 
Committee for a number of 
years. This group has had 
the county history published 
a few years ago. and 
requests for the bixik still 
come in frequently.

The committee is 
especially active at the 
present time focusing atten­
tion on the bicentennial 
observance, and has planned 
a program for May 8 in 
connection with the bicen­
tennial event. The group is 
also active preparing a 
countv museum in the old 
City Fire Hall on north Main 
Street.

Drug
Program
Set

Another reminder was
issued this week 
a program on drugs and 
narcotics addiction to be 
presented at the schm 1 
auditorium Saturday night.
Mav 3.

Speaker for the program 
.sill be Nelson Beckett, chief 
of police in Warr Acres Ok̂  
Beckett has given hundreds 
of lectures on drug abuse and 
addiction, and his visit to 
Foard County is being jointly 
supported by all of the 
service clubs, and several 
other local organizations.

All area residents are 
urged to attend this special 
program on the first 
Saturday night in May.

District Agent Issues 
Area Crop Report

visited Mr. and Mrs. E. A. 
Burgess over the weekend.

Mrs. Sug Ryder of 
Bellflower, Ca.. is visiting 
Mrs. Lula Myers for a few 
days.

Mmes. Joan Daniel, 
Gladys Meek and Ruby- 
Martin went to Wichita Falls 
April 21 to catch a chartered 
bus to Austin to oppose the 
ERA Bill. Mrs. Meek said 
there were about 40 people 
on the bus and many- people 
down at Austin opposing the 
bill. She said there were 
many young people for the 
bill with red. white and blue 
ribbons around their 
shoulders. Most of the older 
people wore pink w ith w hite 
cards with a big red 
'■Rescind'' on the cards. 
Mrs. Meek said the opposers 
arc still working hard against 
the passage of the bill.

Mrs. Richard Winstead 
and Kathy of Seymour 
visited Mr. and Mrs. W. T. 
Cook, Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Davidson of Whiteface and 
Mr. and Mrs. New t Bryant of 
Abilene were weekend 
visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. W. O. Corder.

Sunday. Betty- McDaniel 
and Melissa Gray of Wichita 
Falls visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Martin.

Bill and Harold Myers of 
Lubbock visited Mr. and 
Mrs. C. E. Myers and family- 
over the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Oustad and family of Earth 
visited the E. D. Welch 
family over the weekend,

Mr. and Mrs. Dwight 
Reeves of Wichita Falls 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Simmons, Sunday.

The first Truscott musical 
will be held May- 3 in 
Truscott. The money from 
the musical will go the the 
Truscott Cemetery Associa­
tion. Any former resident 
who wishes to send 
donations may send them to 
Carlton Browder, Truscott, 
■’9260. Everyone is invited to 
come hear the good music.

District extension agent 
Ed Garnett has released the 
following crop report for 
District 3 which includes 
Foard County:

Eastern counties of Dis­
trict 3 have excellent 
moisture, while central and 
western counties are fairly

No Accidents 
Reported on 
Foard Roads

The Texas Highway Patrol 
investigated no accidents on 
rural highways in Foard 
County during the month of 
March. 1975. according to 

Sergeant Billy Dean, High­
way Patrol supervisor of this 
area.

The rural traffic accident 
summary for this county 
during the first three months 
of 1975 show s a total of three 
accidents resulting in no 
persons killed and two 
persons injured.

The rural traffic accident 
summary for the 60 counties 
of the Lubbock Department 
of Public Safety Region for 
March. 1975. shows a total of 
446 accidents resulting in 17 
persons killed and 2 1 '  
persons injured as compared 
to March. I9 '4 .  with .395 
accidents resulting in 23 
persons killed and P 2  
persons injured. This was 51 
more accidents, six less 
killed and 45 more injured in 
1975 at the same period of 
time.

The 17 traffic deaths for 
the month of March. 1975, 
occurred in the following 
counties: three in Garza; two 
each in Ochiltree and
Oldham; one each in Gray, 
Haskell. Jack , Lamb,
Lubbock. Montague, Parker, 
Swisher, Wichita, and
Young.

dn Light rams were received 
across much of the area, but 
the western two-thirds of the 
district still remains dry .

The wheat is making 
excellent growth where 
moisture is adequate. Wheat 
in the central and western 
part of the district sustained 
some freeze damage.

Alfalfa IS making good 
growth with some spraying 
for weevils necessarv.

Western counties lost most 
of their fruit crop due to the 
freeze. Approximately 50 to 
60 per cent of the fruit crop 
survived in the eastern 
counties.

Cold weather has slowed 
spring planting Other farm­
ing activities include soil 
testing and spring applica­
tion of preplant herbicides 
and fertilizer.

treasurer her senior year. 
Ruth has been a member of 
Acteen for four years. She 
has been program chairman 
2 years.

Ruth plans to go to VRJC 
and major in bookkeeping.

Scotch Magic Transparent 
tape in handy dispenser.— 
News office.

GLORIFYING GOD

Our purpose in life should be to glorify God. This should 
be the desire of every man, not only those who are 
Christians.

There are many good people outside the 
church—outside the religious world, who do many kind 
acts, but we know they do not glorify God for they do not 
serve Him,

Christ said, according to Luke 6:46, "And why callee
me. Lord, Lord, and do not the things which I say? 
Obedience to God and Christ must be essential to bring
glory to God. In Ephesians 3:21, the Apostle Paul wrote 

île“ Unto him be glory in the church by Christ Jesus 
throughout all ages, world without end.” The church was 
designed to bring praise to God. Its worship and work are
such that will bring honor, praise and glory to God.

We honor or glorify God by obeying Him. We recognize 
this in our daily life through an understanding that certdaily life through an understanding that cellain 
things we do or fail to do will or will not glorify Him. Our 
need may be to examine our worship to see if it does in 
reality glorify Him.

The New Testament plan of worship consists of five
distinct acts..(l) The Lord’s Supper; “ and upon the first

he disciples were gatheredday of the week, when the 
together to break bread, Paul preached unto them.” Acts
20:7. The original Greek implies the first day of every week 
was their custom in partaking of the Lord’s Supper. In this,**4lsA«r «x/If m *1«. ** A/«*» Al...— /Av .•they continued steadfastly. Acts 2.42. Also (2) teaching
or preaching, (3) fellowship (giving) and (4) prayers. Acts 
2:42. (5) Singing together “ with the spirit^and...with the
understanding also. ’ 1 Corinthians 14:15, Ephesians S;I9, 
Colossians 3:16.

We dare not change the pattern set by God for approved 
worship because the Bible teaches we must not go beyond 
the things that are written. 2 John 9.

Church of Chriat 
120 North 2imI St. 

Crowell, Tcaos

Appointment 
Announced in 
Vernon Area

All types of ledger sheets 
and post binders. — New 
office.

The Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service has 
appointed a resource 
development specialist to 
serve the South and Rolling 
Plains areas of the state.

He IS William D. Benson, 
who will be headquartered at 
the Texas A\M I'niversitv 
Agricultural Research and 
Extension Center at 
Chillicot he-Vernon.

"Benson will be rcspvinsi- 
hle for overall educational 
programs dealing with the 
effective use of resources in 
the South and Rolling Plains 
as well as programs designed 
to stimulate the development 
to certain key resources." 
said Dr. John E. Hutchison. 
Extension Service director, 
in naming the specialist to 
the newly developed 
position. "H e  will work 
closely with county Exten­
sion agents in organizing 
co m m u n ity  r e s o u r c e  
development committees and 
will play a key role in the 
further development of the 
Rolling Plains Economic 
Program (R PEP) and the 
South Plains Development 
(SPD) Program."

Rubber bands, assorted 
sizes. 25c pkg.-News office.

HAIL INSURÀ 
ON WHEAT

INCLUDES FIRE

Coverage effective 12:01 a. tn y  
day of application.

yo u r  b u s in e s s  aitreciaJ

Hughston Insurance i U f c
imiMiimiiMMi
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E N E R G Y  c o n s e r v a t i o n
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West lexas Utilities
Company

R em em ber R eddy s u p p ite ) the energy 
con use it Wisely!

bü’

FRYERS lb 45c
Fresh Ground 2 lbs

b e e f  $1 .4 9
^ u r f  me whole peeled 2 cans

Appricots 99c
Hunts Fancy Tomato 6 cans

SAUCE $.1.00 

Buttermilk 75c
Eatwell Chunks

BONITA
Ranch Style

2 cans

89c
^  Scans

b e a n s  $1.0 0

E  •

KING SIZE

Dr. Pepper
Oak Farms

Buttermilk
Shurfine

COFFEE $
Fresh Crisp

LETTUCE
U.S. No. 1 Russet

Potatoes

II

W e Have
55c

FOODMAR
-TV,
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THE 
FAMILY 
LAWYER

T a t t U ' t a lc  B o o k k e e p e r

Pjrkcr, a hiisinessman. was s\s- 
teniaticall> chcalini: on his income 
taxes. One ila> his conscience- 
stricken bookkeeper txH)k several 
incilminating ilocirments out of 
Par ker's safe and handed them 
oxer to the Internal Kexemre Ser- 
X ice.

In short order, Parker was 
chatted xxith income tax exasion. 
But in court he insisted that the 
exidence. haxing been taken ille- 
g.tlly, could not be used atainst 
him

bi I
to •'e o C.»

\ ;

doors «* “X«
!♦ ft Ha,«

r>9 ««0
r« «V<0|>«

|ir Fthrosis which 
I'rii’s firturc is 

jlitcr every  day 
1 ami all the other 
iple XX ho have 

¡frelrt .lU.riitst this 
Iirttii; The DTO’s 

dex.ide of the

n re .r t  h r e . tk th r r ) t r i ; l i  So for 
K r ic ’s s.tke an d  th e  ttrillions ot 
o th i  r ( h i l i l r i ' i r  a f i l i i t n l  w i t h  
Irriti; dise.rscs . . . keep  ri|i tin 
j;(m h1 xxork I f  so it h ,i\<  n 't roim il 
itt th e  fiuht vt t . . . jo in  today 
K ei p  ’em  sn iilin i;.

e energy

- O C A L  B R E A T H  O F  LIFE C A M P A I G N  "This dearly falls under the
Fourth .\mendment," he said, 
“which forbids unreasonable 
search and seizure."

Flowexer, the court held the exi­
dence admissible and Parker guil­
ty. The court said the constitution­
al ban applies only to searches by 
government agents, not by private 

^CYSTIC FIBROSIS RESEARCH FOUNDATION individuals, 
litres Road, N.E. •  Atlanta, Georgia 30326 Courts generally agree. I hey

say the Fourth Amendment was 
designed to protect citizens from 
prying by the government, noth­
ing more, .\though the private 
searcher may indeed be commit­
ting an offense, the exidence that 
he finds remains acceptable.

The same is true if the ex idcnce 
is discovered purely by accident. 
In another case, a departing guest 
in a motel left a suitcase in his 
room. The manager, peeking into 
the suitcase, noticed some odd­
looking checks. These he reported 
to the police.

Result: the guest was arrested 
for possessing forged checks. The 
judge said that even though the 
manager had no right to look into 
the suitcase, the exidence he found 
was nevertheless admissible in 
court.

But the rule changes when the 
search, although conducted by a 
private person, is done at police 
instigation. Another motel man­
ager told a policeman that he sus­
pected one of his guests of being a 
drug pusher. Instructed to search 
the man’s room, he did so— and 
found heroin.

But this time, the evidence was 
rejected in court because of the

I I I U I  ^  ^ O U l B ^ a  police role in the search.
"The search was just as ‘offi­

cial’,’’ said the court, "as though 
the officer had acted in person.”

A public iervlcc feature of the 
American Bar Association and 
the Stale Bar of Texas. Written 
by Will Bernard.
(g) 1974 American Bar Association
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LOST TO CANCER
Cancer has claimed such 

outstanding people as Babe 
Ruth. Tom Dooley, Eddy 
Duchin. Nat King Cole. Gary 
Cooper. This year 365.000 
other Americans will die of 
cancer. More than 2.3 million 
volunteers of the American 
Cancer Society are seeking 
your support for programs of 
research, education and 
service during the April 
Crusade.

Gummed krafi tape for 
wrapping packages.—Only 
29c at the News office.

GIRLS TRACK TEAM-Coach Randall 
Ryan, right, is shown with members of the 
CHS girls track team. Front row, they are 
Mary Barrera, Beth Graves, Kathy 
W hitfie ld , Kim Norman and Sandra 
Bachman Second row are Rita Washburn, 
Anita Vecera, Mollye Wisdom, Kristi

Shirley and Sabrina Kearney Back row are 
Cathy Sparkman, Gall Dorsey, Theresa 
Coleman and Carolyn Sparkman. Two 
members of the track team, Terri Eavenson 
and Darlene Tucker, was not present when 
the picture was made

TRACK TEAM—Coach Printiss Gidney, 
left, is shown with the varsity track team 
which participated in the district meet at 
Abilene last week end Front row are Mark 
Christopher, Randy Prince, Tommy

Tamplen, Chávelo Ranjel and Dee Finley. 
Back row, Ronny Swan, Rocky Glasscock, 
David Bell, Jack Whitley and Melvin 
Westover

JV TRACK BOYS—Coach Carl Brock, left, 
is pictured here with the CHS junior varsity 
track team which participated in the 
d istrict meet at Abilene Friday and 
Saturday of last week. Front row, from the 
left, they are David Westover, Don

Johnson, Randall Russell, Jay Wall and 
George Brown. Back row are Coach Brock, 
Michael Daniel, Daniel Field, Norman 
Hopper, Rocky Marlow, Junior Carroll and 
William Bachman.

Rotarians Host Little Dribblers 
at Barbecue Saturday Night

Everyone connected with .p layers,  coaches and 
the Little Dribblers basket- officials, were guests of 
ball program here, including honor at a barbecue

S h o p  «t your 
Lo c a l  s t o r e s

SPECIAL EDUCATION
More than 53 million 

Americans now alive will 
develop cancer, reports the 
American Cancer Society. If 
their disease is diagnosed 
and treated early, the 
chances of cúre will be good. 
Your contribution to the 
American Cancer Society 
supports not only research, 
but public education about 
safeguards such as early 
detection.

PRINTING||

Scotch Magic Transparent 
tape in handy dispenser.— 
News office.

For Q u a lity  W ork  
and Fast Sorvico
Phono 6 8 4 ^ 1 1

Tho Foard 
County Nows

News from...

Margaret
Riverside

Mrs. Virginia Smith

sponsored by the Rotary- 
Club of Crowell Saturday- 
night at the community 
center.

The barbecue was pre­
pared by Buster Borchardt. 
Jack  Powers and Rusty 
Russell. A large amount of 
meat for the affair was 
donated by D&T Foodway in 
Crowell. Over 100 people 
were present.

Rotary President Roy 
Whitley was master of 
ceremonies. Rotarian Bill 
Bell, who along with Rusty 
Russell coached the boys 
all-star team, presented 
trophies to the all star boys 
for their winning first place 
in the Benjamin tournament 
several weeks ago.

The girls LD program got 
underway Monday night of 
this week, and the boys 
ended their season two 
weeks ago. Whitley is 
general chairman of the 
Little Dribblers program and 
Rotary Club is sponsor.

Mrs. Mattie Lee Boyd of 
Palinview visited Mrs. R. L. 
Hudgens. Friday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Benny Smith 
and Ray visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Herbert Westbury and 
family in Lubbock, Saturday 
niaht. They also visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Phil Nelson at 
Ralls.

Mrs. Ed Mechell visited 
Mrs. Frank Halencak, Mr. 
and Mrs. Will Tamplen in 
the Woods nursing home, 
and several friends in the 
Monterrey- Nursing home in 
Vernon, Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. John May of 
Weatherford, Ok., visited 
Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Oxvens, 
Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Pruitt and Lynn of 
Sayre, Ok., visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy- Pruitt and family- 
in Roscoe, Saturday.

John Matus Sr. and 
children attended the bed­
side of Mrs. John Matus Sr. 
in a Wichita Falls hospital 
this week after she received 
leg injuries in a fall. She was 
brought to the Vernon 
hospital Saturday.

Charles Diggs of Sweet­
water visited A B. Owens. 
Thursday.

Mrs. Bill Murphy- and 
Mrs. A. B. Owens visited in 
Vernon. Friday.

Lynn Pruitt of Sayre. Ok., 
is visiting his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. George Pruitt this 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Pruitt and Lynn visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe M. Pruitt and 
family- in Snyder. Saturday. 
They also visited Mr. and 
Mrs. W. T. Cartwright in 
Benjamin Saturday- afternoon 
as they returned home.

Mr. and Mrs. R. L. 
Hudgens and Mr. and Mrs. 
Benny Smith and Ray visited 
their mother and grand­
mother, Mrs. W R. 
Hudgens, Sunday in Ralls. 
They also visited Mr. and 
Mrs. J .  E. Hudgens of
Odessa, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Hudgens of Tahoka. Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Keesee of Meadoxx. 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug
Hudgens and daughter, 
Margaret, of Cone, and other 
nieces of Mr. Hudgens’ at 
the home of Mrs. Lendon 
Keesee in Ralls.

Bill and Myron Halencak 
rode in the trail ride to
Paducah Thursday and 
Friday. They also rxxde in the 
parade and grand entry. 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Joe 
Halencak and family- 
attended the stew supper
Thursday- night with the 
Riding Club.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy- Joe 
Halencak, Arlene, and 
Wesley- attended the barbe­
cue supper Saturday night, 
at Mr. and Mrs. Stacy 
Powers.

Mr. and Mrs. Jam es 
Bowers, and Mrs. Ethel 
Fergeson of Crowell visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Bryant 
and boys Saturday in 
Quanah.

Mrs. Ethel Fergeson of 
Crowell, and Mrs. Linda 
Wood of Farmers Valley 
visited Mr. and Mrs. James 
Bowers, Sunday.

Robbie Hudgens of 
Crowell visited Monday with 
his grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R. L. Hudgens and his 
aunt Mrs. Benny Smith and 
Ray.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Hollingsworth of Sw eet­
water, and Mr. and Mrs. Gus 
Russell of Crowell visited 
Mr. and Mrs. James Bowers. 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. J .  E. Ingle, 
accompanied by Mrs. Ray 
Gibson of Iowa Park visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Ingle in 
Grand Prairie, Wednesday 
and Thursday. Kristi and 
Keith returned home after 
several days visit with their 
grandparents.

Mr. and Mrs. J .  E. Ingle 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Will 
Tamplen, and Mr. and Mrs. 
J .  T. Tamplen in Vernon 
Sunday.

Mrs. Tom Smith visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Sweeney 
and son. Stan, in Wichita 
Falls Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. August 
Rumrael spent most of the 
week with their daughter, 
Mrs. Leroy Hobratschk in the 
Wichita Falls hospital. She 
was seriously ill for several 
days following surgery. 
Attending the bedside were 
her two sisters, Mrs. 
Nicholas Schaefer of Azie 
and Mrs. Charles Coker of 
Vernon and Mr.
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50 Cent 
Oranges?

T h e  E n v i r o n m e n t a l  
Protection Agency (EPA) is 
trying to devise federal 
regulations to control truck 
noises which are a nuisance 
to the public.

The plan is to require 
engineering changes in truck 
motors and equipment, 
including, perhaps, quieter 
tires. You might surmise this 
is a problem for the EPA to 
work out with the truck 
manufacturers and the 
trucking operators.

But it ’ s really more 
far-reaching.

The Department of 
Transportation has already- 
added some S2.000 to the 
cost of heavy trucks by its 
new air brake standaids. 
With $3000 added to pay the 
cost of making trucks less 
noisy, the 540.000 to $50,<XX) 
diesel truck may be just 
around the corner.

" I f  that should be the 
case,” a noise expert for the 
Chamber of Commerce of the 
United States said recently, 
"50  cent oranges and fish at 
$4 a pound will become a 
reality. To the extent 
allowable, these higher truck 
prices will be passed on to 
the consumer.”

The Chamber has urged 
EPA to phase in noise 
ceilings over a longer period, 
starting in 19' 8̂, rather than 
lO'”. and to allow three 
years to assess the economic 
impact and develop new 
technology.

Meanwhile, the EPA has 
another problem on its 
hands. If trucks are such 
noisemakers. why is it that 
there xxas little or no 
reduction in overall traffic 
noise levels on the New 
Jersey Turnpike during a 
trucking strike last year’

Program Is 
Planned on 
Beef Problems

A packing company official 
will talk at Haskell later this 
month about the problems in 
slaughtering the new grass- 
fed type of beef.

He is Sonny Bentley of 
Ebncr Packing Co. at 
Wichita Falls, who will be 
on a program sponsored by 
the beef cattle task force of 
the Rolling Plains Economic 
Program and the extension 
service.

The* two-hour program. 
The Beef Cattle Situation, 
begins at 1:30 p. m. April 28 
in Haskell National Bank 
with Gary Mathis of Swenson 
Land & Cattle Co. presiding. 
He is chairman of the task 
force.

Other speakers: Pat Shep­
ard, who will talk about the 
feedlot situatixxn from his 
viewpoint as owner of 
Shepard Feedlots at Hale 
Center, and Dr. Edward 
Uvacek. Vho will discuss the 
beef cattle outlixxk from his 
viewpoint as extension ser­
vice livestock marketing 
specialist.

Jr. Hi 
Track Boys 
EnterMeet

Crowell elementary- school 
boys entered the district 
meet at Abilene last Friday 
and placed the following 
winners:

Billy Brown won first in 
the 60 yard high hurdles. 
John Thomas won fourth in 
the 440. The 440 relay and 
880 relay teams both placed 
fourth. Members of the 440 
team are Angelo Frater, 
Milton Tennell, Claudius 
Coleman, and Thomas. The 
880 relay team is composed 
of Coleman. Tennell. Brown 
and Thomas.

Abel Cerda won first in 
_chinning and sixth in the 

high jump. Brown took 
fourth in the chinning event.

Daniel Field is coach of the 
junior high track team.

Hobratschk’s parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Hobratschk 
of Vernon.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Smith during the weekend 
were J im  Tom Smith of 
Abilene. Ed Smith of Wichita 
Falls and Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Draper of Vernon.

■'T  .
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TRAIL RIDERS GET STARTED —This
picture was made Thursday morning in 
front of the News office as trail riders

began the trek to the Paducah rodeo They 
arrived Friday and rode in the parade 
opening the rodeo Friday afternoon.

Lots of Mail from Government 
Received by News Office

The \ast \olumc ot federal 
mailinjis has been illustrated 
in the office of one small 
u e e k U  new sp ap er — The 
Koard Counts News.

Durink! the past three 
weeks, a total of 'h letters 
base been received in this 
I'ffice from nosernment 
agencies

Bui^esi contributor of 
news releases is the Texas 
W M  extension serxice 
which dunnki the three weeks 
sent the News a total of 20 
separate enxclopes of news 
releases.

The Veterans \dniinistra-

tion mailed the News a total 
of 15 separate cnveli'pes of 
V.-\ stories. Internal Revenue 
Serxice mailed out seven 
different releases.

L'SD.A experiment stations 
sent out 2 releases, and 
I'SD.A's agricultural market­
ing serxice mailed I release. 
I'SD.-V's soil conservation 
serxice sent out 2 releases 
while L'SDA’s food and 
nutrition service mailed out 4 
different releases.

The L'. S. Department of 
Commerce Social and 
K c o n o m i c S t a t i s t i c s  
.Administration contributed 1
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All types of ledger sheets 
and post binders. — News

Parents help children 
enjxiv the s»xial aspect of 
meai time by showing and 
teaching acceptable table 
manners. Mrs. llene Miller 
with the Extension Service 
reminds.

office.

READ e  USE th.

release while one release was 
received from the U.S. 
Department of Commerce 
National Technical Informa­
tion Service.

One mailing was from the 
United States Department of 
Agriculture in Dallas.

Department of the 
Treasury U.S. Savings Bonds 
Division added 3 more 
re leases while one was 
received from the American 
R evo lu tion  B ic e n t e n n ia l  
Administratixxn.

Department of Health. 
Education and W elfare. 
Sixcial Security Administra­
tion. mailed out 5 releases 
while the General Services 
Administration mailed out 2 
different stories.

Two releases came from 
the United States Civil 
Service Commission. U.S. 
Department of Housing and 
Urban Development. Federal 
E n e rg y  A d m in is tra t io n ,  
Bureau of Sport Fisheries & 
Wildlife of the U. S. 
Department of The Interior. 
U. S. Department of Labor, 
and Departments of the 
Army and Air Force National 
Guard of Texas each sent 1 
release.

Multiply that by every 
newspaper in the nation and 
lots of mail sacks were filled 
with government news 
releases.

Bi-Centennial Program 
Planned for Thursday, May 8

Foard County's first bi­
centennial activity since the 
county’s endorsement as a 
national bicentennial com­

munity will take place on 
May 8 at 7:30 p.m. in the 
high school gymnasium. 

Spirit of 76— Third

A&M VET LAB SERVES 
RANCHING INDUSTRY

The Texas Veterinary 
M e d i c a l  D i a g n o s t i c  
Laboratory at Texas A iM  
University exists mainly to 
serve Texas ranchers, says 
Dr. W’illiam Sippel, 
executive director of the lab. 
The lab serves as a test 
center for animal specimens 
to identify disease problems 
so that specific treatment can 
be administered. Lab 
personnel also help in the

commerce of animals by 
performing various tests 
required for interstate or 
international shipment of 
livestxKk. Through the study 
of disease specimens and 
overall animal health 
conditions, lab officials issue 
warning of seasonal diseases 
through veterinarians and 
the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Stencil correction fluid 
available at the News office.

RC&D Has Annual Banquet 
in Crowell Last Tuesday Night

The annual Four Winds 
RC&D Banquet held in 
Crowell Tuesday evening of 
last week climaxed the 
planning stages of the 
Project Plan.

Forty-six representatives 
of counties, cities and local 
citizens were present from 
Childress, Cottle, Foard and 
Hardeman Counties to enjoy 
the delicious meal and 
fellowship.

New officers elected by the 
Executive Board prior to the 
banquet are; Henry Black, 
chairman; 0- Richards, vice- 
chairman, and Sam Breed­
love, secretary-treasurer.

Certificates of Apprecia­
tion were presented to 
Keith Pitner, Claude 
Holcomb. Jr.,  Walter Lock 
hoof, Joel McClellan. Judge 
Bob Arnold and Ben Boston 
for their participation and 
contributions to the RC&D 
Project during the past year.

Executive Board members 
to serve the Four Winds 
RC&D Project for the coming 
year are; Henry Black and

Eldon Whitman from Foard 
County; Judge Roy Neal 
Parks and 0- Richards from 
Cottle County; Ernest Rea 
and Leonard King. Jr. from 
Childress County and Sam 
Breedlove and Gladstone 
McLennan, J r .  from 
Hardeman County.

Von Kleibrink, Project 
Ccxjrdinator, gave a brief 
summary of the past year's 
activities. He stated that on 
March 21, 1975, official word 
was received from Washing­
ton that Wilbarger County 
would not be included in the 
Project Area. The Four 
Winds RC&D Project Plan 
that included the counties of 
Childress, Cottle, Foard and 
Hardeman was mailed to the 
Soil Conservation Service 
State Office for review on 
March 24, 1975. Kleibrink 
also informed the group that 
plannning authorization had 
been obtained on Roadside 
Erosion Control for the 
counties of Cottle, Foard and 
H a r d e m a n .  P l a n n i n g  
authorization had also been 
obtained Tor Critical Area

A Weakly Report Of Agn Business News

arm-facts
Compiled From Sources
Of The Ten« Department of Agriculture
John C . W hite, Commissioner

Vegetable Harvest In Progress. . .  Still More Than 
Chicken Feed . . .  Wheat Crop Increases.

If vegetables are one of your favorite foods, you will be 
happy to know that vegetable harvest is well underway m 
the R io Grande Valley and other commercial areas of the 
slate. Texas ranks number one and among the top three in 
many categories of comntercial vegetable production, and 
this IS the time of year when a number of crops are being 
harvested, cultivated, and planted.

Everything from  watermelons to carrots to tomatoes is 
making good progress.

Cabbage harvest in the Valley is in its final stages, and 
supplies from  the San Antonio-Winter Garden area will tie 
available throughout the spring months. A small acreage in 
the Trans-Pecos should be harvested in May or June.

Carrot harvest w ill continue in the Valley through May. 
Supplies should also be available in other producing 
sections throughout May.

Sweet corn harvest is expected to get underway m the 
Valley around mid-May. Planting is underway in other 
sections of the state.

Cantaloups are making good progress with harvest 
expected to  get underway in mid May. At Laredo, the crop 
is repiorled to be doing well, and in the Winter Garden area, 
the crop is planted w ith  seeds beginning to emerge.

If you like tomatoes, there’s more good news. Spring 
tomatoes are making excellent growth in the Valley. Most 
growers report good stands w ith good to excellent fruit.

Picking of some early fields is underway with the 
majority of the crop to  be harvested next month and into 
June. Some replanting was necessary in Central Texas due 
to a freeze, and planting m north Texas and on the High 
Plains is currently in progress.

And early in May you can expect the first of the 1975 
watermelon crop from South Texas. Most melons in South 
Texas are vimng. Planting is underway in Central and East 
Texas as well as north Texas.

If onions are to your liking, the Texas Crop arnf 
Livestock Repiorting Service notes that the 1975 onion crop 
for Texas is now forecast at 17 per cent below last year's 
crop. The crop is also six per cent below the March 1 
projection.

Peak movement of onions should occur from now 
through mid-May. A t Laredo, onions are being harvester). In 
the San Antonio-W inter Garden area, the harvest is 
expected to  be underway in the near future.

Century USA will be the 
topic of the patriotic program 
which will be musical and 
narrative. Every person in 
Foard County who is glad to 
be an American should 
attend this program as it will 
portray our nation in the days 
which preceded "the shot 
that was heard around the 
world" on April 19. 1775, to 
the present time.

One outstanding feature of 
the program will be the 
presentation of a bicenten­
nial flag to the community.

The program is being 
sponsored by the b i­
centennial committee of 
which Don Welch is 
chairman and the Foard 
County Historical Survey 
Committee.

SUBSCRIPTIONS TO NEWS
Subscriptions to the News 

received since April 12 
follow:

Mrs. A. B. Cummins, 
Quanah; F. T. Crews, San 
Angelo; Clark Christian, 
Alamogordo, N .M .; J e s s e  
Whitfield, Crowell; Kenneth 
Sellers, Tyler; Lester Patton, 
Route 2, Crowell; Lena 
Thompson, Newcastle, 
Wyo.; N. M. Barrera, Route 
2, Crowell; Mrs, Clyde 
Alverson, Fort Worth; 
Kenny Ownbey, Killeen; Joe 
W. Coufal, Route 1, Crowell; 
Jerry L. Francis, Richardson; 
Mrs. Pat Harris, Houston; 
George Davis. Crowell; 
Carlon Ribble, Crowell; Mrs.

Bertha Burdine, Route 1, 
Crowell; Charles D. Burdine, 
San Jose, Ca.; Mrs. Lula B. 
Moyer, Lynwood, Ca.; Roy 
Dickerson, Inglewood, Ca.; 
Otis P. Smith. Panhandle; R. 
H. Emery, Crowell; Mrs. 
Maggie Campbell. Crowell; 
Mrs. Pauline Snow, Corona. 
Ca.; Mrs. Pearl Hubbard, 
Oceanside. Ca.; Jimmy D. 
Werley. Crowell; Antone 
Kubicek. Route 2. Crowell; 
Valton Wallace, Mesquite; 
Vidella Teague, Nevada City. 
Ca.; Alfred Eddy, Vernon; 
Bob Wisdom, Spearman; 
Woodrow Johnson. Amarillo; 
Billy G. Whitley, Austin; A. 
G. Glidewell. Vidor, Texas.

Treatment of the Crowell 
school campus.

Marion Porter, Area Con­
servationist, of the Soil 
Conservation Service at 
Terrell, Texas, concluded the 
banquet with his address. 
Mr. Porter encouraged the 
group to ignore county and 
city lines and work as a group 
to accomplish each individual 
project. He emphasized 
c o n s i d e r i n g  m u l t i p l e  
purposes for all projects such 
as erosion and flood control, 
recreation, irrigation and 
municipal water supply. 
Slides were shown of RC&D 
work being accomplished in 
other parts of the state.

The Foard County Soil and 
Water Conservation District 
hosted the banquet, and the 
meal was prepared and 

'  served by members of the 
W omen’s Service League. 
Mr. Black served as master 
of ceremonies and the 
invocation was given by Joe 
Coufal of Crowell. A 
welcome to Foard County 
was extended by County 
Judge Seth Halbert.

Q m U T
PR IN TIN G

We solicit your 
job printing 
business, and 
will give prompt 
service on all 
orders.
NEWS OFFICE 

684-4311

l it t l e  DRIBBLERS BARBECUE-This
picture was made last Saturday
at the community center as the Rotary Club

honored girls and boys ol th* ixj 
Dribblers basketball prograir

QA&P Records Put on 
Microfilm at Texas Tech

, baby daughter
na. w«s born 
KB haspital 1 

i 17. to Mr. i 
, Dotólas Mil 

Tbe baby

The records of a 120-mile 
railroad that brought settlers 
and commerce to several 
West Texas Communities 
have been preserved on 
microfilm by the Southwest 
Collection at Texas Tech 
University.

The Quanah. Acme and 
Pacific Railway (Q.A&P). 
originally established in 1903 
to connect gypsum mines at 
Acme, with the Frisco 
railroad in Oklahoma, 
eventually pushed westward

to Floydada.
Headquartered in Quanah. 

the QA&P servedHardeman. 
Cottle. Motley and Floyd 
counties, and until 1973 was 
a vital link in carrying 
transcontinental traffic for 
the Frisco and Santa Fe 
lines.

A railroad historian 
described the Southwest 
Collection’s acquisition of 
the record on 186 reels of 
microfilm as a "tremendous 
liftoff" for the study of short

Who Knows Best?

A RETURN OF THE BACKYARD FLOCK of chickens 
IS picking up th ro ^ h o u t the state as people search for ways 
to cut food But the "p in money" days of bygone
years for the small backyard hen flock have long since 
disappeared. Poultry production is hig business now in 
Texas.

During 1974, gross income from broilers, eggs and 
chickens totaled $253 million. This is six per cent less than 
during the 1973 marketing year, however. Broiler 
production in 1974 was slightly above 1973 while gross 
income was four per cent under 1973. Egg production was 
down nine per cent from 1973. Cash receipts totaled $104 
m illion, down eight per cent from 1973. Cash receipts from 
chickens (other than broilers) was 10 per cent less than in 
1973

IN CASE YOU MISSED IT, here it is again, and it is 
worth repeating. Texas wheat crop this year is forecast at 
140 m illion bushels. That's up 20 per cent from the Dec. 1 
projection.

That's a stark contrast to the puny 1974 crop of only 
52,800,000 bushels of wheat produced in Texas.

The majority of the 
American people, according 
to a recently revealed opinion 
poll, do not believe this 
country needs another 
bureaucratic agency to liHik 
after consumer interests.

Yet. the 94th Congress 
seems more determined than 
any of its predecessors to 
enact a law creating such an 
agency, regardless of what 
the people may want.

According to a nationwide 
survey of public attitudes 
conducted by Opinion 
Research Corporation of 
Princeton, N.J., a majority of 
American consumers are 
opposed to creation of a new 
agency for consumer 
activities.

Given a choice between 
• creating a new consumer 

agency or taking steps to 
make existing consumer 
agencies (at least 33 
operating more than 1.0(X) 
consumer related programs) 
more effective, the 

- r e s p o n d e n t s  fa v o r e d  
strenghtening existing 
agencies by a margin of 75 
per cent to 13 per cent.

Of the 13 per cent who 
favored a new agency, more 
than half said they would 
rather forget the idea when 
informed that it would cost 
J60 million to run the agency 
its first three years of 
existence.

These findings are 
consistent with arguments 
advanced by such groups as 
the Chamber of Commerce of 
the United States in opposing 
similar bills over the past five 
years.

If the present consumer 
agencies are not doing the 
job it is not likely that the 
problem will be solved bv 
creating still another agency 
Bureaucracy doesn’t work 
that way.

Recently. S.200 sponsored 
Ribicoff

(D-Conn.). which would 
establish an Agency for 
Consumer Advocacy was 
approved by a Senate 
committee, Ralph Nader was 
Its leading advocate at 
hearings before the commit­

tee.
Unless consumer speak 

up. they may find such an 
agency crammed down thetr 
throats. While Congressmen 
mav not believe in ptdis. they 
do believe in letters from 
constituents hack home.

It’s up to you. Who knows 
what's best for vou?

SENIOR CITIZENS MEET
Crowell senior citizens 

met in a regular 
luncheon meeting 1'uesday 
with 2h members and 5 
guests. Mr and Mrs. Elavil 
Yeaklev and Mr and Mrs. 
Don Crafion and Sally 
Sowell, assistant county 
extension agent Hro. Yeak­
lev gave the devotional 
before lunch Sally Sowell 
demonstrated preparing a 
calico skillet dinner which 
was later served at lunch.She 
gave an interesting talk 
about meatless meals that 
can be tasty, satisfving. fun 
and nutritious. She also gave 
out pamphlets with recipes 
tilled "How to Go Meatless 
with Protein on Your Side."

The winner of the dtnvr 
prize was Emma Belle 
Bounds. The prize was 
donated by Ida Sellers.

The senior citizens bake 
sale will be Saturday. May 
10. They have the tickets for 
the handmade quilt to be 
given away Saturday. June 7.

Residents are invited to 
contact one of the senior 
citizens about the quilt. 
Guests are always welcome 
at the center.

The average annual 
income of Texas families 
headed by women in 1%9 
was about half that of all 
families—$5,360 for female­
headed households com ­
pared to $9,955 for all 
households. Source: " T h e  
Darker Side of Childhood.” 
published in 1974 by the 
Texas Department of 
Community Affairs. Office of 
Early Childhood Develop-
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Girls Little Dribblers Action 
Got Underway Monday

. Dribblers
^sketball got underway at 
Wildcat gym Monday night. 

Opening the night’s action
m between
10-yjar-old girls. The Blue

w l i h K ‘’y R“«Washburn, won 6-4 over the 
Crowell Cutíes coached bv 
Kirtr Norman. For the 
winners. Lynne Johnson had 
4 Fxvmts and Mitsi Kuehn 2 
Betty Coleman scored the 
Cutíes 4 points.
c„‘"  «ame. the
Spitfires coached by Sally

Gerhardt and Carolyn
Sparkman, won 20-16 over
, . ^̂ o‘shots, coached by
Jam s Everson and Judy
Carpenter, P „  Gerhardt led
the Spitfires in scoring with
•S points. Anetta Dorsey
scored 3. Patty Black

Scoring for
T '  were Inetta

• Ncomi Rodriquez
Poll w *  2 andPolly Wisdom I.

Winding up the night's 
tion

Wranglerettes and Green
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All are always welcome.— 
First Christian Church. 
Crowell. 3 5 ,

Mack Gha/al arrived here 
Saturday for a short visit. He 
came to accompany his wife 
and children back to their 
home in Benghari, Lybia, 
North Africa. Mrs. Gha/al. 
the former Miss Cindy 
Erwin, and children have 
been here visiting her 
parents and grandparents, 
Gordon Erwin of Crowell. 
Mrs. Herman Knight of 
Ouanah. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Pal McDaniel. She also 
visited her brother. Bill 
Erwin and wife of Vernon.

Mr. and Mrs. J .  T. James 
of Staples visited Mrs. Li/zie 
Kenner last week.

Miss Willie Davenport of 
Fort Worth is visiting 
Crowell relatives this week.

Mr. and Mrs. J  T. Boa/of 
Lubbwk spent Sunday with 
Mrs. Boa/'s sister, Mrs. Carl 
Wishon, and husband.

Mr. and Mrs. Houston 
Adkins visited Saturday and 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Speer and son. Wells, 
of OIney. and .Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Lance and family 
and Nancy Gafford of Fort 
Worth, and Mr. and Mrs. 
James Adkins and family of 
Arlington. They also visited 
Lori Dockins and Mrs. Nan 
Sue Dockins at Baylor 
Hospital in Dallas w here Lori 
is recuperating from injuries 
received in an auto accident.

. and Mrs. Pat 
r the weekend 
children and 

Mr. and Mrs. 
Daniel and 

JL^ra and Jim, of 
lead; Mr. and 
n Knight and 
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Ir. and Mrs. 
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last week with 

Mrs. Gladvs

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wishon 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Hunter 
Lambert in Quanah Satur­
day. Mr. Lambert was a 
patient in the Quanah 
hospital at that time.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Cogdcll have been visiting 
her mother. Mrs. Onic 
Jen k in s ,  in the Quanah 
hospital and also Crowell 
relatives for several days. 
They returned to their home 
in Houston Monday.

Ladies Auxiliary of the 
Free Will Baptist Church will 
serve lunch Friday. April 25. 
from 11:.TO until 1:30 at the 
church. $2.25 for adults, 
$1.50 children under 12.

42-ltc

Scotch Magic Transparent 
tape in handv dispenser.— 
News office.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Berkenfeld and son, 
Dwayne, of Goree and Mrs. 
Gayle King, Lauri and Jason, 
of Wichita Falls spent the 
weekend here visiting their 
parents and grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Rusty Russell.

Mmes. J .  M. Barker and 
Loys Thomson were in Tulsa, 
Ok., last week attending a 
seminar at Oral Roberts 
University. While in Tulsa, 
the women visited the 
O s b o r n e  F o u n d a t i o n  
Museum. En route to Tulsa, 
they spent Wednesday night 
in Anadarko, Ok., with Rev. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Bingham, 
former Crowell residents. 
Rev. Bingham was pastor of 
the Assembly of God Church 
in Crowell for several years.

Riding Club 
to Make Ride 
to Vernon

Members of the Crowell 
Riding Club will be leaving 
from the southeast corner of 
the square at 9 o’clock next 
Tuesday morning, April 29, 
on a trail ride to the Santa 
Rosa Roundup in Vernon. 
This trail ride to Vernon has 
been an annual affair for the 
ItKal club for a number of 
years, and Rusty Russell, 
president, is expecting 
another big group of riders.

The group will spend the 
night at the farm home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Lehman 
and everyone is invited to go 
to Lehman's for a barbecue 
supper beginning at 7 o’clock 
Tuesday. Tickets are $2.50 
for adults and $1.50 for 
children 12 years and 
younger.

The riders will continue on 
in to Vernon Wednesday and 
will ride in the parade that 

afternwn.
Uniforms for riding with 

the cluh in the parade consist 
of light colored hat. red tie, 
white shirt, blue Levis and 
red blanket.

Russell added that a total 
of 45 riders rode into 
Paducah last Friday as the 
liK-al club made a ride to the 
Paducah rodeo.

GOVERNOR OOLPH BRISCOE SIGNS VETERANS DAY BILL — 
Tht tignini of Stn. Bill 11 rntorini VcUrtiu Day to ita ori|inal date of 
Novambar llth  ia witneaaed by key Lagulatora and DepartnMnt Com- 
mandtr of The Amarican Lafion in Texaa. James W White of Houston 
Others shown arc Sen. Mike McKinnon, Corpus Christi; Rep Albert D 
Brown, Jr., San Antonio, Commandar Whita. Gov Briicot. seated. Sen. 
Lindon Williama of Houaton, Lagialative Chairman for The American 
Lagion; and Rep. Doyle Willia of Fort Worth. Commander White laaued a 
atatamant thanking all membera of the Legialature and the Governor for 
their aupport of tht change He said, "All veterana in Taxaa art grateful for 
the change"

JV Boys W in 2nd

That popular Liquid Paper 
for sale at the News office.

Rubber bands, assorted 
sizes. 25c pkg.—News office.

CROP HAIL INSURANCE 
Wallace Moorhouse Insurance

-43dl "Your Protection oer Profession” Mun'iay, Texas

Crowell High School’s 
junior varsity track team won 
second place in the district 
meet held at Abilene last 
week. Coach Carl Brock 
listed the following places 
won by Crowell youths;

Oran Carroll won two first 
places at the meet, in the 
discus throw and 440 yard 
dash. His distance in the 
discus was 137-3 and he had 
a time of 58.9 in the 440. 
Willie Bachman won first in 
the shot with a throw of 44-6, 
while Jay Wall took first in 
the 100 yard low hurdles in a 
time of 12.7.

Second place w inners were 
Carroll in the shot with a 
throw of 93-6; David 
Westover in the 880 in a time 
of 2.25-3. Both relay teams 
placed second. The 440 yard 
relay team is made up of 
Rocky Marlow, Daniel Field. 
Wall and Carroll. Running on 
the 880 relay team are 
Marlow, Randall Russell. 
Carroll, Field and Willie 
Bachman. Time for Crowell's 
880 was 144.5. and in the 440 
Crowell's time was 49.7.

Third place winners from 
Crowell were Bachman in the 
440 dash, with a time of 60.2 
and Norman Hopper who 
took third in the 50 dash with 
a 6.2 time and in the discus 
throw with 121.9.

Marlow with a time of 60.7 
won fourth in the 440 dash;

Wall in a time of 9.2 won 
fourth in the 60 high hurdles 
and Westover won fourth in 
chinning with 18.

Fifth place winners from 
Crowell were Field in the 
broad jump with 16.1 and 
Don Johnson in the 60 high 
hurdles with a 9.6 time.

George Brown tcnik sixth in 
the discus with 108.3, 
Marlow in chinning with 14 
and Westover in the 60 high 
hurdles in a time of 9.7.

Field qualified for the 
finals in the 100, but failed to 
place. Coach Brock said 
"With a little bit of luck we 
could have pulled out 
another win. But the 
coaching s taff  was well 
pleased with the effort put 
forth. Crowell was well 
represented in District 7-A.’ ’

The eleven boys making 
up the junior varsity track 
team were Oran Carroll, Jay 
Wall, Don Johnson, Randell 
Russell. Michael Daniel, 
David W estover, George 
Brown, Willie Bachman, 
Rocky Marlow, Daniel Field 
and Norman Hopper.

Edgar B.
Spears
Died

Edgar B. Spears, 46, of 
Mesa. A/., a native of Foard 
County and son of Mrs. T. A. 
Spears of Crowell, died 
Wednesday of last week in 
Mesa. Funeral services and 
burial were held Saturday in 
Mesa.

Mr. Spears was born here 
and attended Crowell schools 
until the family moved away 
in 1943. His mother had just 
recently visited him in Mesa, 
but had returned to her home 
here at the time of his death.

He is survived by his 
mother, wife, one daughter 
and one step-daughter; and 
two brothers. Ernest Spears 
of Altus, Ok., and Fred 
Spears of Kingsland. Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest Spears 
attended the services in 
Mesa.

Deadline
Nears

Comptroller Bob Bullock 
— reminded 225 ,000  retail- 

businesses Friday that April 
30 is the deadline for sending 
in quarterly sales tax reports.

’ ’ I t ’ s just around the 
co rn e r . ’ ’ Bullock said. 
’ ’Tardy returns mean 
nothing but trouble to both 
us and the taxpayer.”

Reports due April 30 cover 
the January-March quarter. 
Forms for the reports were 
sent to all sales tax permit 
holders by Bullock’s office in 
March.

Bullock said that most 
delinquencies "a re  strictly 
o v e r s i g h t  — b u t  th e
consequences are the 
same.”

Mr. and Mrs. Fowler L. 
Carroll of Pasadena visited 
from last Thursday until 
Monday of this week here 
with his nephew, Jam es 
Sandlin, and Mrs. Sandlin.

Mimeograph stencils, both 
regular and church bulletin. 
Try a package soon.—^News 
office.

News from...

Thalia
Maggie Capps

Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Aurbach of Dallas spent the 
weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Cates and 
grandmother, Mrs. Georgia 
Johnson.

Mrs. Bessie Rake of 
Graham visited Mrs. Maud 
Johnson and other friends in 
the Woods Rest Home in 
Vernon, Saturday.

Mrs. Jim Moore spent the 
weekend with her cousin, 
Mrs. Pauline Jimison of 
Spur.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Eavenson and Rosanna 
attended funeral services fur 
Mrs. Eavenson’s aunt, Mrs. 
Mary Armitage of Oklahoma 
City. Ok., Saturday. She was 
87 years old. She had visited 
here several times and will 
be remembered by the many 
friends she had made in the 
Crowell and Thalia area.

Mrs. Jake Wisdom and 
daughter, Pollye and Mrs. A. 
B. Wisdom visited Mr. and 
Mrs. George Streit in their 
home near Lockett, Tuesday. 
Mrs. Jak e  Wisdom and 
Pollye and Mrs. Karen 
Wisdom attended the band 
concert in Vernon.

Joe Laird of Iowa Park 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Moore Sunday.

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. T. R. Cates Jr. last 
weekend were their son Pat 
of Lubbock and a daughter, 
Terri Cates of Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wisdom 
and Mrs. Tommie Patterson 
of Medicine Mounds visited 
the Wisdom families here 
Sunday.

Mrs. Aline Durham of 
Levelland and daughter, of 
New Mexico visited their 
sister and aunt. Mrs. Maud 
Johnson in the Woods home 
in Vernon last week.

A host of relatives and 
friends of Earl Hopkins 
attended his funeral services , 
Saturday at the Thalia 
Church of Christ, where he 
was a member.

Mr. and Mrs. Oliver 
Holland spent the weekend 
visiting his son Ronny 
Holland and family of 
LiKkney.

Mrs. Fannie Webb and 
daughter, Mrs. Jess ie  
Thompson of Breckenridge 
and another daughter, Mrs. 
Dorothy Mann of Dallas 
visited Mrs. Maggie Capps

CROP HAIL 
INSURANCE

In O ld L in* Stock Companlos 

HAIL W IS I— W l SP iC IA LIZ ill

4

Don’t Delay!
Get It Today!

H ail Policies Include Fire Protection

Spencer &  Oliphant
INSL’RA.NCE AGENCY

Phone 684-4481

Pages
Foard County News

Cromwell, Tx., April 24, 1975

Tuesday of last week.
Mrs. Ora Abston was 

brought home for her 86th 
birthday. Sunday, April 20. 
She spent the day with her 
sons. Burl and Robert and 
grandson. Dale.

Burl Abston and son. Dale, 
visited their son and brother. 
Burl Abston Jr. and wife in 
Abilene Saturday. They also 
visited points of interest in 
the city and surrounding 
area. Burl Abston Jr. and 
wife are established in their 
new apartment and doing 
nicely. Mr. Abston is 
employed by a lumber 
company.

Mr. and Mrs. Dee Powers 
and Bobby Dee visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Powers, Mr. 
and Mrs. Danny Robertson 
and Donna and Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Powers and infant. 
Shelli Jo, all of Midland last

Office North Side Squrc

weekend.
Rev. and Mrs. Wallace 

Pierce took a large group of 
youngsters on a hayride and 
a wiener roast Wednesday 
night of last week.

EXPANSION OF FORAGE 
FED BEEF

Large scale production of 
forage finished beef is in the 
offing for the southern 
United States, predicts an 
agronomist at Auburn 
University. This production 
will increase when it 
b e c o m e s  e c o n o m i c a l l y  
feasible. Present problems 
include uneven seasonal 
distribution of forage, 
pasture damage from hooves 
of animals, low digestibility 
of some grasses, and 
legumes not adapted to 
certain soils. A marketing 
problem is that the pro­
duction of forage finished 
beef results in a varying 
supply of slaughter cattle.

YOU are welcome 
First United 

Methodist Church
Sunday School starts at........ 9:45 A . M.
Sunday morning worship at 11 A . M. 

Sunday evening worship at 7:00 P. M.

NOTICE
Spectators at the fire which 
damaged the Guy Todd Jr. 
home Tuesday, A p ril 8, 
blocked the street and 
interfered with movement of 
the fire trucks. This practice 
endangers both life  and 
property.

W e ask everyone to keep the 
streets clear when there is a 
fire. Otherwise, we will have to 
levy fines to those who impede 
travel of the fire trucks. Thank 
you.

CROWELL VOLUNTEER  
FIRE DEPARTM ENT

Leonard Tole, Chief
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Society
Engagem ent 
Is Announced

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Polk of 
Dumas have announced the 
onuajtement and approach­
ing marriage of their 
daughter. Sharlett. to Doug­
las Chowning. son of Marion 
C'howning of Truscott and 
the late Wilma Carroll 
t'howning.

Miss Polk and Mr. 
Chowmng will be married in 
the latter part of May at the 
First Baptist Church of 
Dumas

The bride-elect is a 
graduate of Dumas High 
School and is a political 
science major at Texas Tech 
Universits in Lubbock.

The prospective groom 
graduted in I'i"'! from 
Crowell High Schixil and is 
currentU attending Texas 
Tech as a civil engineering 
major.

The couple are candidates 
for graduation in the 
summer

The number of Texas 
teenagers marrying is 
increasing at a rate four 
times that of all Texans. 
Source "The Darker Side of 
Childhood." published in 
l<f~4 b\ the Texas Depart­
ment of Community Affairs. 
Office of Early Childhiuid 
Development.

Diamond Rings 
Wedding Bands
When You Think of 

JEWELRY

Think of
O'Neal’s Jewelry 

1731 Fannin 
Vernon Texas

Brunch
Given
Saturday

Mrs. Robert Kmcaid. 
chairman of the Foard 
County Chapter of the 
American Cancer Society, 
honored kval volunteers with 
a brunch in her home 
Saturday morning at 10 
o’cliK'k.

Guests were seated at 
quartet tables and the 
extended dining table which 
were covered with matching 
white clothes embossed with 
large yellow and orange 
daisies.

The buffet featured a 
cluster of yellow candles. 
Orange juice, sausage, egg 
and mushroom casserole. 
Hawaiian fruit salad. Swed­
ish twists and coffee 
comprised the menu.

Workers received their 
Crusade packets which they 
will be using this week in 
contacting donors.

Volunteers attending were 
Mmes. Thomas Tamplen. 

Fred Collins. L. H. Wall. Bill 
Klepper. H. L. Ayers Jr .,  
Johnny Kajs. Freddie Rieth- 
mayer, Cecil Davis,Jon Lee 
Black. Vernon Whatley, Guy 
Todd Jr..Billy Johnson and 
Kenneth Fox.

DRIVE IS POSTPONED
The Patrons of Library 

drive set originally for this 
week, has been postponed 
indefinitely due to conflicts, 
according to Mrs. Ray 
Shirley, president of the 
Foard County Federation of 
Women's Clubs, the Patrons 
of Library drive is sponsored 
by the library committee of 
the federation.

MIMiMMINi

First Baptist Church 
WELCOMES YOU

....................................................................... ............. ......................................................... .....................m i....... .

................................................................................. . .

W e  A re  Licensed to Sell 
Pre-Need O r Pre A rranged  

Funerals
by the State Banking Commission.

See us soon for detailed information!

W om ack Funeral Hom e
iNIWIHmiHMmHMMMHMMIHMmHmMiMMMMmillHIMMMmiM

Member F. D. 1. C.

is now paying the following  
interest rates on

Certificates of Deposit:
Single and M ultiple M atu rity  Time 
Deposits of less than $100,000.00:

30 to 89 Days 5 , 0 0 %
5.50%
6.00%

2! f e a r s . . . . 6.50%
The above rotes are

All Existing 
Certificates of Deposit 

in force with this hank.

90 DAYS TO 
LESS THAN 
I YEAR

I YEAR TO 
LESS THAN 
21k YEARS

Truscott 
W om en Go to 
Austin

Four women from the 
Truscott and Gilliland area 
were part of a group of 40 
women who traveled by 
charter bus to Austin last 
week to attend a hearing 
Monday of last week in the 
Texas House chamber on a 
proposal to rescind the 1972 
Texas ratification of the 
Equal Rights Amendment.

Going on the trip from 
Truscott and Gilliland area 
were Mmes. Gladys Meek, 
R. C. Daniel and Homer 
Martin.

The 600 seats in the 
gallery were emptied and 
refilled eight times as 
spectators stood in line for 
hours to hear the testimony. 
Most of those opposing ERA 
wore pink dresses, providing 
a veritable “ sea of pink” at a 
rally held on the capitol 
steps. Most opposing ERA 
were also identified by "Stop 
ERA" buttons and 3x5 inch 
cards with the word 
"Rescind."

Norma McPherson of 
Vernon has been a leader in 
the rescind ERA movement 
in this section of the state 
and she is quoted in the 
Vernon Daily Record of 
Wednesday, April 16, as 
resenting a letter from the 
nation's first lady. Mrs. 
Betty Ford, which was 
presented at the Austin 
hearing by State Rep. Sarah 
Weddington. a former 
Vernon resident and 
supporter of ERA.

Mrs. Meek told the News 
last week that it was the 
"experience of a lifetime" 
for her to attend the Austin 
hearing, and she added that 
should she be needed to 
testify in Austin against 
ERA. she would borrow the 
money, if necessary, to make 
the trip on behalf of "women 
who want to be women.”

Federal law and regulation prohibit the payment of 
time deposit prior to maturity unless three months of 
the interest thereon is forfeited and interest on th# 
amount withdrawn is reduced to the passbook rate.

Gummed kraft tape for 
wrapping packages.—Only 
29c at the News office.

Hints to Homemakers poirdSunfyNews
rrnwell. Ts., ApfM 24, 1975

Eastern 
Star Gives 
Awards

SALLY SOWELL 
AaalaUuit Coanty 
Extcnalon Agcat

Floors might be consider­
ed as the 5th wall in your 
decorating plan. Floors have 
great design possibilities in 
creating individuality in 
decorating plans.

Look-alike, unmemorable 
floors are fast losing 
popularity. Give floors that 
one-of-a-kind quality by 
working with vinyl and stone

Adelphian 
Club Has 
Meeting

The Adelphian Club met 
on Wednesday, April 16, at 
the club house. Hostesses for 
the ix'casion were Mrs. Bill 
KIcpper and Miss Sally 
Sowell.

Mrs. E. M. Sollis reported 
that the dead trees in the 
yard at the club house will be 
removed and a man has been 
employed to keep the yard 
this summer.

The club voted to buy a 
storm window for the 
museum at the old fire hall.

Mrs. L. A. Andrews led 
the pledge to the United 
States flag.

In discussing import­
ant issues in the nation, Mrs. 
Velma Wilson discussed the 
energy crisis and how it hit 
very suddenly in Delaware 
where she was living until 
last year. Stations open only 
two hours daily left long lines 
of cars without gasoline.

The May 14th meeting of 
the club will be the last 
mcetng of this calendar year.

shapes in new ways. Color 
and design of an Indian- 
themed wall-paper can be 
exploded into a pow wow 
patchwork of a dazzling floor 
by using custom cut vinyl 
tiles fitted to zigzag across 
the family room.

For practical flooring, 
consider ceramic tile. It is 
easy to mop and 
handsome, even if • 
country dirt gets tracked on.

But if it is simplicity or a 
return to the past you have in 
mind, use a serene polished 
sweep of Italian Marble.

You may even use tiling as 
you would an area rug. 
Border the "Tile rug in a 
lively design with a contrast­
ing solid color, or cut and 
insert colored geometric 
shapes such as triangles and 
squares. If you don t want 
straight lines, chotvse a sheet 
of vinyl that's embossed w ith 
a flowing curvy design.

When selecting floor 
covering you need to 
consider the overall color 
scheme. It's a go<xl idea to 
keep the largest area a 
subdued color. Floors receive 
the hardest wear of any 
surface in the home due to 
the dirt and grit that's 
constantly ground into the 
finish. The kitchen especially 
receives more spills and 
stains normally than any 
other floor covering.

Depending on the 
material, design and care 
given it, the floor can raise, 
depress, or do nothing for 
the overall appearance of the 
room.

the
the

PROGRAM CANCELLED
A program featuring 

Jerrcll Wilson, punter for the 
Kansas City Chiefs fixvtball 
team scheduled to be 
presented here Tuesday 
morning was cancelled.

Ora Mae Fox, Kansas City 
Life Insurance Co. repre­
sentative here, said Mr. 
Wilson and his party were 
grounded in Lubbock 
Tuesday because of heavy 
fog. Wilson had scheduled 
many visits to West Texas 
towns Tuesday, and the 
grounding of his airplane 
forced cancellation of most of 
them.

His visit here was to have 
been sponsored by the 
Kansas Citv Life Insurance
Co.

Social
Security

May is Older Americans 
Month by proclamation of 
President Ford, and social 
security representatives are 
available to talk to groups 
and organizations interested 
in senior citizens programs, 
according to Kenneth R. 
King. Branch Manager of the 
Vernon Social Security 
Office.

“ We have accurate, up-to- 
date, free information about 
social security, Medicare, 
and supplemental security 
income," Mr. King said. 
“ All of these program affect 
senior citizens. If your group 
or organization wants to 
know more about them, you 
can make arrangements for a 
speaker by calling or writing 
any social security office."

Speaker at 
WSL Meet

Mrs. Russie Hord told the 
highlights of the recent State 
Federation of Porcelain Art 
Clubs convention meeting in 
Brownsville. She was accom­
panied by Mrs. Ruth 
Kenner. Mrs. Hord was 
introduced by Mrs. Eva 
Sloan, program chairman.

With the numerous 
demonstrations in progress, 
the some 500 women also 
visited many commercial 
booths and attended a 
number of socials— including 
a very impressive costume 
show.

The Foard County women 
visited Matamoros, Mexico 
where they toured a church 
and residence and went 
shopping. They made the 
trip to the valley via car and 
enjoyed sightseeing en 
route. Mrs. Hord showed the 
WSL members many of the 
pieces she had painted.

Quilt 
Drawing 
Is Set

Winner of the Women's 
Service League hand pieced 
guilt will be determined at 
4 p.m. Friday at the West 
Texas Utilities office. The 
public is invited to attend 
although the winner does not 
have to be present in order to 
claim his prize. The SI .00 
tickets will be available from 
WSL members until time for 
the drawing.

More Nutrient To The Acre
Research shows that more 

food nutrients can be produced 
from an acre of sweet potatoes 
than from any other crop that 
can be grown on an acre.

ATTENTION! EX­
STUDENTS OF THALIA  
SCHOOL:
The reunion of the ex­
students and teachers of 
the Thalia School will be 
held on Saturday, July 5, 
1975.

Make your plans now to 
attend.
THALIA EX-STUDENTS 

ASSOCIATION

Local H D  
W om en Go to 
M eeting

Three Foard County Home 
Demonstration club women 
and the extension agent 
attended the annual spring 
Texas Home Demonstration 
Association district meeting 
in Wichita Falls this past 
Thursday, April 17. Mrs. 
Grover Moore, delegate from 
the Riverside Club; Mrs. 
Clarence Garrett, delegate 
from the Gambleville Club; 
Mrs. Betty Chatfield. 
Gambleville Club member, 
and Sally Sowell, the 
extension agent attended the 
meeting.

Eighteen co u n ti^  were 
represented at this district 
meeting. The morning 
speaker. Mrs. Merle 
Anthony spoke on the theme, 
"Home—the foundation of 
A m erica ."  The Skylarks 
from Sheppard Air Force 
Base presented a medley of 
songs following lunch. Mrs. 
Woodrow Chervenka, State 
THDA Secretary, brought a 
message from the State 
Board. Recommendation 
skits were presented by six 
counties on possible club 
programs in family living, 
citizenship, safety. 4-H, 
cultural arts and recreation, 
and health. Haskell county 
extended an invitation for the 
next spring meeting to have 
the theme of Heritage 
Festival in 1976.

A gent Offers  
Series on Food 
Preservation

The Foard County Exten­
sion Agent is offering a 
mailout series, “ Preserving 
Food at H om e,"  to 
interested homemaker.

The mailout series 
include information on can­
ning and freezing fruits and 
vegetables; pickles and 
relishes; preserves; jams; 
jellies and marmalade.

The season for fruits and 
vegetables is just around the 
corner. Enroll soon to get 
your mailout series so that 
you can study and be ready 
to conserve your surplus 
fruits and vegetables at the 
peak of quality.

With inflation and the 
need for stretching the food 
dollar, this is a way to make 
your dollars go further and 
have high-quality food 
your family.

Are you interested 
enrolling in the series? Here 
is how!

Write your local County 
Extension Agent Sally A. 
Sowell, Box 516, Crowell or 
call her at 684-2901.

The mailout series 
begin in May.

In keeping «'th 
Bi-Centennial theme.
Rev W O Rucker, pastor ot 
First United Methodist 
Church, showed slides with 
commentary of Abraham 
Lincoln's restored birth 
place, its grounds and 
furnishings at an open 
meeting of Crowell Chapter 
So. 916. Order of the Eastern 
Star, on Tuesday. April 1̂  
the Masonic Hall. He was 
introduced by Mrs. Vera 
Thomas, worthy marton. who 
welcomed guests and read a
poem entitled "Friendship ^

Rev. Rucker also showed 
slides of wild flowers— 
weeds—which he had taken 
throughout the United 
Slates. He detailed the types 
of cameras he used and his 
technique. He gave the 
invocation preceding the 
dinner for which Mmes. 
Bernice Carroll. Alycnc 
Pitlillo. Maggie Gentry and 
Gladys Moore were 
hostesses. Mrs. Vctrice 
Gentry was program chair­
man for the evening.

W. R. Moore, worthy 
patron, presented a 25-year 
membership pin to S. H. 
Gentry. Pins were mailed to 
Mrs. Mattie Rec Bates and 
G. R. Choate who were 
unable to attend.

Mrs. Evelyn Davis was 
accompanist hir the opening 
and closing songs Mrs. 
Lizzie Kenner registered 

from Electra.
Burk-

TOLE TE X A C O  IS NOW F,
b u r e a u  t ir e  d e a l e r  for Fi
COUNTY H A N D LIN G  
SAFEMARK TIRES.

THIS IS ANOTHER SERVICE FOR OUR f, 
■UREAU MEMBERS.

Th# Farm BurMu Mambart' Iniurtne, 
coma Ural •« your Taxaa Farm Buratu ii 
Companlaa.

You daal with paopla who know larmlng 
work with Farm Buraau mambari avwy j,, 

Your Crop Hall Policy providat quality 
covaraga at lha lowatl nat coal poiiibia 

Your elalmaman ara tpaclallata In ad|uitin| 
loaa.

Thia adda up to battar aarvica lor Farm 
Mtmbara.

• Dlvidonda wara paid to 1971, 1972, and lyjj, 
hail pollcyholdara Inaurad through yourTaun  ̂
Buroau Inauranca Companlaa—Ih# low dd, 
companiOB.

FOARD co unty! 
FARM BUREAU

Phona 664-6481

Texas households headed 
by mothers with children 
under 18 have nearly 
doubled in 10 years, from 
103.641 in I960 to 192.322 in 
W' Ô. Source: "The Darker

Crowan.îj

Side of CkiiL 
published in n’t] 
Texas Depanme«| 
munity Affairs,. 
Early Childhood; 
ment.

BEST RESI

guests
Seminole. Vernon, 
hurnetl and Knox City.

I t ’s Tim e to 
Renew Notary 
Commissions

Texas secretarv of state 
Mark While last week 
announced that all presently 
commissioned notaries
public desiring reappoint- 
mefci for ihe new term which 
begins June I, I9"'5, and 
ends June 1. 19''"', must pay 
for the required fee and file a 
new oath and bond with the 
countv clerk between Mav 1, 
19'5. and Mas 15. 19'5’.

He added that any person 
nol now a notary public who 
desires appointment for the 
beginning of the new term 
June 1. should apply to the 
county clerk before April 30. 
1975. The required applica­
tion forms may be obtained 
from the county clerk.

White emphasized that 
notaries public should not 
send requests for appoint­
ment or for commissions 
directly to the secretary of 
state as the law specifically 
provides that the county 
clerk approve notary bonds 
and forward copies of the 
application to the secretary 
of state.

to
up HI

*1 5 0 0 1
FOlffI

tax< 
iiui

„ . i t v ’ .'
iSlK- ...

It s sour choice You can go ahead and pas incomc<l 
ot vour earnings Or you can create sour ossn ' 
RHirement Account ilKA), and pas little or noc 
come la« on the amount you sase up to Vi# ' 
under the new Pension Reform Vt. it sou do 
in a pension plan sshere you work you can rsuNcj 
own individual retirement plan with fa> dectuct'Orij 
That could mean up to SIS.OOt) in deductible sasiT!| 
the ne«t ten years
This IS important and valuable enough to bewortliil 
your time so Kansas City life. The lioneis 
introduce you to one ot our people who can Mp I 
pie have an IRA Planning Kit which pros ides vo»i»'9l| 
wav to make your plans. So just give one otourp 
or drop us a line, and we'll make sure sou getac

ORA M A E FOX!
PHONE 684-5911 
CROWELL, TEXAS
rhfLitxx'vs /»><iyii/»jtmic|
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will

CABBAGE
ORANGES

F0IaGER*S

INSTANT
Vital Crop Protectors

Experts estimate that more 
than the U S. crop output 
would be lo.st if there were n 
insectlclde.s to com bat the 
roughly 700.000 species that fly 
or crawl.
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SPICIALS GOOD THURSDAY, FRIDAY AND SATURDAY

FRYERS Grade A
Pound.

Ground Beef 2Ib s.

FRANKS W ILSON SAVORY
Pound. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 59

U tm tT fl MWOR- A USTWS MVISTMiNT M  K M W U M I

START 
YOUR 

SET
___ TODAY

7 0 7 *

PORK CHOPS 1.29
PORK STEAK ^ 85

Half-Gallon $119

Half Gallon 7 5 p
H A G E  C H E E S E  6 5 p

ante PineappU Grapafrtiit—46 os. D e i M o n te

ante Italian Cut

ANS 2 ^ 9 *  SA UCE 4 M I »
INA Carnation 2  cans H  ^

TE

'CH UP King Size 26 oz. 5 9 0
KING SIZE

IBECUE SAUCE 8 9 *
PRODUCE

2  pier. 3 5 *
NO. 1 RUSSETS

PEA S 2 0 9 e
C e feka rd t’a H o t D og

COLD POWER 
Giant 9 9 0

DASH
2 0  lbs. $ 5 9 9

Quarters-Pound

Cheese Shurfine Cdby Longhorn 
1 0  oz. Pkg.. . . . . . . . . . . . . 79

WHITE HOUSE

1 0 0

PO TA TO ES
lOAlne

A P P L E  S A U C E
DEL MONTE

FRUIT COCKTAIL
DEL MONTE

r e A R S  303 can

Satino
2 7 9 0
24190

RED HEART— NO. 1 CAN

DOC FOOD 7cap i n o n
WORTZ—ASSORTED

CO O KIES 3  pier. 1 1 «
L. LEAF

CHERRY PIE M X 6 9 0
euisco DEL MONTE— 303 CAN

3#
con ^ 9 9

Shurfine U sants 6-79

SPINACH 4  c a e  sin o
BOUNTY

TOWELS
2 io iL 0 9

D rR e p p e r
6 i o m i
CARTON 7 «

••••••aa«oeBaoo»aaaaaaaaoaoaa*»»aaMa»a»»»»»aM»»»»a»»a»aa«aaaas»»»aosa»»»»»»a»»a»»»»»ao

anU t»dcu^ Phone 684-2171

D&T FOODWAY

Page 7
Foard County News

Crowell, T*., April 24. 1975

30 Years 
Ago in 
The News

News items below were 
taken from the Thursday. 

April 19, 1945 issue of The 
Foard Countv News:

Franklin Delano Koosevelt 
who had only begun his 4th 
term as president of the 
United States, died suddenly 
at the Little White House at 
Warm Springs, Ga., Thurs­
day, April 12. Harry S. 
Truman of Missouri, vice 
president, was immediately 
sworn in as president and 
took up the duties of the 
office on Thursday evening. 
Crowell paid tribute to the 
late president in a memorial 
service held at the Methodist 
Church Saturday afternoon, 
with the churches of Crowell 
cooperating. Participating in 
the memorial service were 
Rev. G. O McMillan, pastor 
of the Christian Church. 
Mrs. Arnold Rucker. Rev 
Otis Strickland. Judge Leslie 
Thomas. Rev. R. S. Watkins 
and John Rasor

All preliminary arrange­
ments for the Ninth Annual 
4 H Club Calf. Pig and 
Poultry Show have been 
completed and the show will 
be held at the Self Motor Co. 
building next Saturday, April 
2 1 .

D. N. Bird was notified by 
the government in late 
December, 1944, that his 
son. Pfc. Richard Bird, was 
missing in action and the 
first word received of or from 
him are two cards and a 
letter, received Saturday and 
Monday from Richard, which 
slate that he is a prisoner of 
the Germans and doing all 
right.

S-Sgt. Clyde C. James, 
who was in a German prison 
camp from Sept. 9, 1944. 
until March 11, 1945. arrived 
at the home of his wife's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Minyard in the Margaret 
community .Monday. Sgt. 
James landed on the East 
Coast Tuesday morning of 
last week. He is on a 90-day 
furlough.

The following Foard 
County men were inducted 
into the Army in Dallas on 
April 13 and forwarded to 
Fort Sam Houston: William 
S. Temple, Glen H. W’il- 
liams. Harvey E. Aydelott. 
Sam T. Holloway. Joe H. Fox 
and Stanley R. Whitten 
Inducted into the Navy at the 
same time were W’iHie P. 
Ford and Clury H. Flowers, 
who were forwarded to San 
Diego, Calif.

An entire trainload of 
cattle. 38 cars, was shipped 
from Crowell Sunday to be 
fattened on grass pastures in 
Kansas, near Virgil. The 
shipment consisted of 1.350 
head of 3- and 4-ycar-old 
steers and are owned by W. 
B. Johnson and Paul Shirley. 
After being kept in Kansas 
for a period of several 
months, the steers will be 
shipped to market.

There was an egg on 
display in the Thalia Cafe 
which measured 10x7‘.j 
inches and inside this egg 
was another egg with a hard 
shell and the white of 
another. The egg was 
brought in by C. C. Wisdom.

Ray Tamplen. who is in the 
Navy, left Friday for San 
Diego, Calif.

Edwin Edgin, who is 
employed at Winters, spent 
the week end visiting his 
mother, Mrs. J .  E. Minor.

DECIDE ON COW HERD 
Cattle producers should 

decide now how many cows 
they plan to keep over next 
winter. believes an 
agronomist for the Texas 
A g ricu ltu ra l E x te n sio n  
Service, so that they can 
produce enough forage  
during the coming months. 
Once this is determ ined, 
then the rest of the herd 
should be sold. And this 
should be done as soon as 
possible. Fertiliier must be 
applied to boost forage  
production; a straight 
nitrogen fertilizer is best for 
maximum forage growth. 
Apply about 200 pounds ef 
ammonium nitrate per acre 
It takes about 40 bales of hav 
to winter a cow . and this ha\ 
should be in the barn b\ ’
I.

à
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The County Agent Says...
(tarland R. lemen» 

Count\ t%icn<>U)n Atteni |

Deciitlonk On Wheat l)ama|{e 
Outlined

Personnel from the 
Research and Hxtension 
Center at Chillicothe-Vernon 
have made an extensive 
survev of the area \»ith 
produs'ers and counts Fxten- 
Sion a^tents to determine 
factors causing; damaite to 
vs heat

Freeze damajte is by far 
the bijiuest problem, 
although some diseases are 
showing up in isolated areas. 
Damage is more extensive in 
the northern half of the 
district with little damage 
iKcuring south of Dtekens, 
Stonewall. Haskell and 
Thrivkmorton counties.

Although damage is wide­
spread. not all fields are 
damaged Freeze damage 
seems more asssKiated with 
plants under stressed

by Bud 
McLain

After the Rough Riding
was over. Teddy Roose­
velt spent a lot of time 
making what he hoped 
would be remembered as 
profound statements. One 
of those IS proving itself 
more everv year... “ We 
cannot afford to lose that 
preem inently  typical 
American, the farmer who 
owns his own land.” 
Many theories abound. 
Robert Aubrey lists it as a 
manifestation of what he 
calls the "Territoria l 
Imperative.” Others ob­
serve simply that a man 
will work harder for 
himself than for someone 
else Undoubtedly true, 
but another, immeasur­
able factor is involved... 
pride. American farmers 
are proud to be able to 
each produce enough for 
themselves and 50 others. 
And they're smart. Smart 
enough to use the right 
portions of ecology, 
mechanization, chemical 
know-how and manage­
ment to make the same 
land produce more every 
year. In h5 years 
production per acre has 
increased more than 620 
percent. The RoughRider 
was right, we can't afford 
to lose the familv farmer.

McLain 
farm Equip,

Case Tractor Dealer 
Phone |«17|6M-2321 

Crowell. Texas

conditions from low fertility 
and insects or the stage of 
development or a combina­
tion of these factors. 
Generally, early and late 
maturing varieties exhibit a 
smaller percentage of 
damaged heads than the 
intermediate varieties.

Symptoms of freeze 
damage are yellow or brvtwn 
flag leaves (last leaf around 
head I assvKiated with dis­
colored growing points. 
When upper stems are split 
to expvvse the head, freeze 
damaged heads will be very 
small and yellow or brown.

Each producer should 
inspect individual fields to 
determine the degree of 
damage. Field inspections 
have indicated damages 
ranging from very little to 
almost complete head 
destruction. The percentage 
of head damage in any field 
is the best indication of 
damage at this time.

Costs in this crop are all 
fixed at this point in 
production. The choice 
facing the producer is what 
method of disposition to 
make with this crop. He may:

1. Harvest with combine as 
he had planned originally.

2. Harvest crop for hay.
3. Graze out.
4. Plow under and plant a 

summer crop.
Each producer should 

weigh his own situation and 
decide on which alternative 
will best suit his program.

There is a possibility that 
heads w hich show no present 
evidence of freeze damage 
may later prove to be sterile. 
There is no practical way of 
evaluating this situation until 
after flowering or seed set. 
continuous inspection of 
fields should be made.

Cage Your Tomatoes
Using cages to support 

plants rather than staking 
and pruning has proven to be 
one of the best methods to 
use in growing tomatoes. 
This technique helps support 
the plant and keeps the fruit 
off the ground. The plants 
are allowed to grow naturally 
within the cages.

Cages in the shape of 
cylinders can be made of 
reinforcing wire, hog wire, or 
similar material. The 
cylinder should be 18" to 
20" in diameter and 2*/j to 5 
feet tall. Concrete reinforc­
ing wire is generally 
considered best. Most come 
in varying lengths but most 
commonly in 5 ft. widths. It 
takes a length of about 5Vj ft. 
to make a tomato cage 18" in 
diameter. The cages are held 
together by bending and 
crimping the ends of the wire 
around one of the vertical 
wires.

The cages should be 
placed over the tomato plants 
about when they start to 
bloom and set fruit. Allow 
one plant per cage. Eor 
support, the bottom ring of

D & W  Welding 
Shop

SOUTHEAST CORNER OF SQUARE

Phone 684-7351

Hard Surfacing 
Portable Welding 

General Repair Service
Also handling acetylene, oxygen and all kinds 
of welding supplies.

Bobby Dunham 
Hal Williams

NOTICE FOR BIDS
The Board of Trustees of Crowell 

Consolidated Independent School 
District offers for sale on a bid basis the 
following property:

Riverside—4 ac. out of Section 35, 
Block 8, H&TC RR Survey.
Thalia—All of Lot 10, Tarver Add. 
493.3’x683.1’ [approx. 7.74 ac.] with 
two brick buildings, high school bldg, 
approx. 150’x70’ and gym bldg. 
80'x85’ with 16’ ext.

Bids will be received up to 5:00 P. M . 
Monday, May 12, 1975. The school 
reserves the right to reject any or all 
bids.

J. H. Gillespie, Secretary 
Crowell Cons. IrKf. Schl. Dist. 

Box 398,
817-684-2821

Crowell, Texas 79227

the cage can be snipped off 
so that the cage can be 
pushed into the ground. 
Additional wiHvden or metal 
stakes to keep the cage from 
falling over later in the 
season may also be needed.

The Beef Cattle Sltoatloii
The Rolling Plains 

Economic Program is 
sponsoring a program on the 
beef cattle  situation on 
Monday. April 28. The 
meeting will begin at 1:30 
and take place in the Haskell 
National Bank Community 
RiHvm. A registration fee of 
$2.00 will be made.

Topics of the program 
include: the feedlot situation 
from a feeder viewpoint; 
problems associated with 
killing grass-fed beef; and 
the beef cattle outkxvk.

The beef cattle price, to 
say the least, has been 
somewhat dim. For this 
reason you will want to make 
an effort to attend and learn 
about what the future holds 
for the beef cattle industry. 

Throckmorton Ranch Tour
The 1975 Texas Experi­

mental Ranch Field Day will 
be conducted Thursday, 
April 24 at the ranch near 
Thrivk motion. Registration 
($3.00 includes lunch) for the 
event which takes place at 
the ranch headquarters 
begins at 8:00 and ends at 
11:00 a m.

The first bus tour of the 
ranch will leave at 8:30 a.m. 
and the last tour will depart 
at 11:00 a m.

Lunch w ill be served at the 
County Show Barn in 
Throckmorton. The a f ter­
noon program will include a 
discussion of the highlights 
of the ranch research 
program in Texas.

Hospital
Admissions,
Dismissals

PudenU Admitted:
Robert Evans, Slaton
James A. Garrett
Mrs. Cora Whatley
Mrs. Thola Knox
Charlie Wishon
Mrs. Edna Ledbetter
JoAnna Hord
W. L. (Boss) Johnson
Mrs. R. L. Walling,
Paducah
M. D. Durham

Patients Dismissed:
Susan Quintero 
Carol Sue Scott 
Mrs. Ettie Johnson 
Rev. M. L. Crosby 
Mrs. Jessie Swearingen 
and infant daughter 
Mrs. Bud Clifton 
Mrs. Tom Westbrook 
Miss Lucy Randolph 
Mrs. Daniel Urquizo, Jr.

Sales Tax 
Checks Are 
Mailed Out
Comptroller Bob Bullock 

issued $16.1 million in 
checks last week in the first 
ever monthly payment of city 
sales taxes. Last week's 
payments went to more than 
500 towns and cities for taxes 
collected between Feb. 18, 
the cutoff date of the last 
quarterly pavment. and April 
4.

Although Crowell does not 
have a city sales tax. a table 
released by Bullock shows 
what towns comparable in 
size to Crowell received.

Munday received $862.21, 
Knox City $1.346.18.

GRIFFITH  
Insurance Agency 
General Insurance ;

Old Line Legal 
Reserve Companies

Vj 1
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NO HUNTING. Fishing or 
trespassing of any kind 
allowed on 'T. R. Cates Estate 
land. pd. to 5-75

NO TRESPASSING of any 
kind allowed on any land 
owned by the B. A. Whitman 
Estate or Eldon Whitman. 
_________pd. 9-1-75_______

NO TRESPASSING of any 
kind or trash dumping on 
John S. Ray land. — Mrs. 
John S. Raŷ ________ pd. 1-76

NOTICE—No hunting, fish­
ing or trespassing of ahy kind 
allowed on my land in Foard 
and Knox Counties.—Mrs. 
Maggie Barker._____ pd. 1-76

NOTICE—No hunting, fish­
ing or trespassing of any kind 
allowed on the Minnick 
Ranch.— Mrs. J .  H. Minnick 
Estate._____________pd. 1-76

NO hunting, fishing, tres­
passing, or trash dumping on 
any land owned or leased by 
us.—Mrs. W. A. Dunn and 
Bobby Bond. pd. 5-75

NO trespassing. Positively 
no hunting or fishing on land 
owned or leased by Walter 
Thomson or Allen Taylor. 
Trespassers will be prose­
cuted. pd.5-1-75

NO TRESPASSING on any 
land leased by me in Foard 
and Knox Counties.—Mike 
Wishon. pd. to 5-75

Election
Results
Told

Only 214 Foard County 
residents went to the polls in 
the special constitutional 
amendment election held 
here and across Texas 
Tuesday.

Foard voters turned down 
both proposals. No. 1, which 
would affect state and school 
retirement systems, was 
defeated here 111 to 101. No. 
2, the perennial request for a 
raise for state legislators, 
was defeated here 126 to 86.

That popular Liquid Paper 
for sale at the News office.

Shirley-Youree
Drug

MR. LANDOWNER:
Call us for all your 
range, weed and brush 
control needs.

Licensed Tordon Applicator

HAROLD HARDCASTLE

Hardcastle Ag-Air,Nc
Of 1. 817-SS2-9591 Rm . 817-882-77S8

OFFICE HIGHWAY 70, LOCKETT. TEXAt

TRESPASS NOTICES

TRESPASS NOTICES

NO T R E S P A S S I N G -  
Positively no hunting on land 
owned, leased or rented by 
us. Trespassers will be 
prosecuted.—Mr. and Mrs. 
J . J . McCoy. pd. 9-75

TRESPASS NOTICE—No
hunting or fishing or 
trespassing of any kind 
allowed on any Merl Kincaid 
land. pd- l “ f*

NO DUMPING of any kind on 
any right-of-way of any 
county road in Foard County 
allowed. Violators will be 
prosecuted.—Commission­
ers' Court of Foard County, 
Texas. tic

NO hunting or fishing or 
trespassing of any kind on 
M. L. Hughston and M. L. 
Speer land._______pd.l 1-6-75

POSITIVELY no trespassing, 
fishing or hunting on my 
land. Trespassers will be 
prosecuted. — Mrs. Harry 
Schlagal. _________pd. 5-75

TRESPASS NOTICE—No
hunting or fishing or 
trespassing of any kind 
allowed on any land owned or 
leased by us.—Johnson & 
Ekern._____________ pd. 1-76

NOTICE TO PL'BLIC-Any 
non-members caught fishing 
in the Spring Lake Country 
Club will be prosecuted to 
the fullest extent of the law. 
This lake is for members only 
and others will please stay 
out.—Board of Directors, tfc

NOTICE—No hunting, fish­
ing. or trespassing of any 
kind allowed on our 
land.—Glenn Halsell Cattle 
Co. _______pd. 1-76

NO hunting, fishing or 
trespassing of any kind 
allowed on any land owned 
by the Juanita Gafford 
Estate. pd

pd. 1-76

NO TRESPA SSIN G— Posi­
tively no hunting or fishing 
on any of our land. 
Trespassers will be prose­
cuted.—Otis Gafford.

pd. 1-76 ____

NOTICE
That in accordance with 
Article 13*̂ 70 of the Penal 
Code -  CRIMINAL
TRESPASS (Senate Bill III 
passed by the 62nd Legisla 
ture). notice is hereby given 
that all lands of the W. T. 
Waggoner Estate are 
posted — save and except 
where written permission is 
given to come upon the 
s a m e .  — JO H N  B IG G S ,  
TRUSTEE tfc

NOTICE
That in accordance with 
Section 30.05 of the Penal 
Code of Texas—CRIMINAL 
TRESPASS, notice is hereby- 
given that all lands of J .  i. 
(J im ) Malone, being 73g 
acres, more or less, in the 
Mark B. Lewis Survey in 
Foard and Hardeman 
County. Texas, together with 
lands leased by J .  I. (Jim) 
Malone contiguous thereto, 
are POSTED.

ROSS MALONE, Guardian 
of the Person and Estate of 
J .  I. Malone. 15-ifc

Truscott 
Musicals Are 
Planned

Bookkeeping for 
All Types of Small 

Businesses and 
Farmers

Barker &  Smith 
Bookkeeping and 

Tax Service 
Ph. 684-3711

LEOTIS ROBERTS 
AND

RICHARD WINTERS

FOR TERMITES 
R«MchM, Silver Fleh, 
AaU and Sntrploaa. 

FOR ALL TYPES INSECTS

TREE SPRAYING
•®9 M|. ft. for oiMler howeea. 

HAVE STATE UCENSE
Pd. 5-75

l o d g e  n o t ic e s NOTICES

ALLEN HOUGH POST 
NO. 9177, VETERANS
OF FOREIGN W ARS

Meets every 1st 
and 3rd Thurs 
day evenings at 
7;,30 o'cliK-k in Iht” 
Community Center.

Baylor Wcatherred. Crd. 
Freddie Riethmayer. Qm.

Mattress renovating.-West 
Texas Mattress Co.. 35.30 W 
Wilbarger. Vernon Texas 

40 tfc

n o t i c e —General repair 
,^ork. Call us day or night. 
nH4 6731.— Langford's 
Garage— Dub and Clyde.

31-tfc

CROWELL CHAPTER 
NO. 916. O.E.S.

Meets second Tues 
day night of each 
month. The next 
meeting will be

t e r m i t e s ? Tree spraying 
or roach control. Licensed 
and insured. Call Ray 
Quintero. American Pest 
Control. 6H4-.5472.

42-tfc

May 13,8:00p.m '•
Members please lake notice. 
We welcome all visitors. 

Vera Thomas, W' . M 
Mareiita Carroll. Sec.

CROW ELL LODGE NO. 840 
AF&AM Suied Meeting 
Second Monday ^
of each month.

May 12, 8:00 p.m u
Members urged to attend 

and visitors welcome.
P al P it l i l lo .  W .M .
Robert Kincaid. .Sec.

Custom swathing and hay 
haling —Gifford Wilde, Rt. 
2. Munday, Texas 76371. Ph. 
422-4895.

THALIA LODGE NO. 666 
AF&AM Suted Meeting 
Fourth Mondav of each 

month. April 28, 8 p.m.
Members urgently re­
quested to attend. Visitors 
alwavs welcome.
V\ R Mixire.W' M 

Joe Coufal. Sec.

FOR RENT
FOR RENT—Trailer spaces, 
water, electricity and storm 
cellar. 684-5841. 31-tfc

FOR RENT—Trailer spaces 
for 2 trailers $2.00 per day. 
all hills paid.— Clarence 
Cook. 684 5411. 4l-2tc

LOST
lOST—Yellow and white bob 
tail male cat Wearing black 
collar. Call 684-6001.

42-ltc

WANTED
WANTED—Baby sitting at 
night or after school. Call 
Melissa Burclsmiih. 42-lic

EOR RENT—House. 5 rooms 
and hath. 509 Texas 
St.—James Long. 8 miles 
north of Crowell, left side 
highway. Phone 8.39-4485.

42-6tc

WANTED TO BUY-Com- 
bined alfalfa seed. Contact 
Wi t h e r s p o o n  R a n c h ,  
915-548-4367 collect.—Jim 
Terry 42-2tp

GARAGE SALES

W’.a n t e d —Competent 
typist to train to operate 
electronic ty pesetter Call 
684-4311.

42-tfc

The first Truscott musical 
this spring will be held 
Saturday, May 3, according 
to information received from 
Paul Bullion of Truscott. The 
proceeds from the musicals 
will go for the upkeep of the 
Truscott cemetery.

Mr. Bullion says everyone 
is invited to attend, enjoy the 
music and donate to the 
cemetery fund.

Former Truscott residents 
who cannot attend are asked 
to mail their donations to 
Carlton Browder, treasurer 
of the Truscott Cemetery 
Association.

NOTICE!
The annual stockholders 

meeting for the Farmers 
Co-Op. Gin of Crowell will 
be held

SATURDAY, APRIL 26 
at the gin office. 
t im e  IS 1:00 P. M . 

You are urged to attend!

Ben Barker, Mgr.

WELLS AG.
a v ia t io n

Counly-« Only R M M m t Ao.
flying Strvio«

FOARD CO. AIRPORT

pomplete Sprayini 
Service!

h e r b  w e l l s
684-7191 Day or Night

f o r s

SALEHS, 
room houst

T( l̂
M O R A S  M
U h ild resv, 1^.

410, 4Í 
“ ’’ i' Vernon
C em ete ry
^ ‘•'lection  of 

granitt.
'ases of broil#

F O R  YOUR 
an d  curbing • 
D enton , t"

NOTICE— Alcoholics Anony­
mous meets 8 :00  p.m. 
Wednesday. Community 
Center. 655-2483 for
information.

33 25tp_________

House for rent. 3 bedrixvms. 
To a couple, no children and 
no pets .—Clarence Cook, 
684-5411. 4l-2tc

Garage sale Thursday, 
Friday and Saturday in the J .  
A Marr garage, 407 N, 1st 
Street 42-ltp

FOR SALE-1 
house and btf 
buildings, gti  ̂
orchard. 62? W| 
Call Bud Hardii 

3’-ik

Caterpillar for hire. Raking, 
grubbing and dirt work.— 
Gary Bryant. 663-5814,
Quanah. _____

FOR SAIE-I 
bargain. S««j 
between 7 indi

FOR SALE-id 
blackeycd g« 
Feed.

ihthNO regret. 
Lustre dens 
fully. Rent elc; 
cr $1.-W R

FOR SALE 
bedroom 
M ancua —0#

FOR SALE- 
strcichcrs- 
Box 6'’ 1. Ctj

FOR SALE-ll 
house, gariftl 
house. beaunWi 
location. piT;;| 
Clarence Coot

G rain I
Big garage sale Saturday 
only. 8 :3 0 — Fred Adcock, 
next to last house on E. 
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sizes in 
Farm II Equip-
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684-2651.
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Chevy pieW 
automatic-
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expect the l 
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at lowest pt 
Mrs. Gweno
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SPIRIT̂ Î 
l if t ? 

Yoo*̂ *
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