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CITIZENS OF THE YEAR . . . Mrs. Dorothy Green and Earl Harris
were named "Citizens of the Year" during a breakfast by the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce and Agriculture Thursday 
morning. Harmon Elliott, left, made the presentation to Harris,

second from left; Marshall Cook, right, made the presentation to 
Mrs. Green. In the background is Ted Barnhill, outgoing president 
of the Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce. Approximately 70 persons 
attended the breakfast.

Nurse Training To Start
Tomorrow (Monday) is the 

final date this fall to take an 
aptitude exam required for en­
trance into the vocational nurs­
ing program at South Plains 
College classes now being orga­
nized for the spring semester.
The test is scheduled at I p.m. 

in the Technical Arts Center 
office of Bill Pohl. vocational 
counselor, and the fee is SI.

West Plains Medical Center in 
Muleshoe is one of several 
hospitals affiliated with the 
program. Others are Cook Me­
morial Hospital. Levelland; Me­
dical Arts Hospital and Little­
field Hospital, both in Little­
field; Cochran Memorial Hospi-

around

Muleshoe
The Bill Lamberts welcomed 

Thanksgiving with some of their 
grandchildren, including Steve 
Davis of Dallas and Susan Lee 
and Debbie Reich of Midland.

• • • * •
Visiting in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. Jim Shafer during the 
Thanksgiving holidays were 
Christine Gifford of Colorado 
Springs, Colo.; Ninoska Mance- 
bo of New York City; Cadets Jim 
Meyers of St. Paul, Minn.; and 
Ed Connelly of New York City, 
as guest of Cadet Larry Shafer 
of the Air Force Academy at 
Colorado Springs.
The two girls were house 

guests of Cassie Precure and 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Precure.

* * * * *
Post-Thanksgiving guests in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Kemp in Amarillo are her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Creamer.

tal in Morton and University and 
Highlands Hospitals in Lub­
bock.

South Plains College’s 12- 
month vocational nursing pro­
gram includes 27 weeks of 
classroom and lab work and 23 
weeks of clinical experience in 
one of the affiliated hospitals.

Upon successful completion of 
the program, students will re­
ceive a certificate of proficiency 
and become eligible to take the 
examination given by the State 
Board of Vocational Nurse Ex­

aminers. Those who would pass 
the state exam will be issued a 
license qualifying them to prac­
tice as licensed vocational nurs­
es.

During the pre-clinical period, 
students attend classes 30 clock 
hours a week studying topics 
such as anatomy and physiolo­
gy, mental health and mental 
illness, disease control and pre­
vention and vocational nursing 
skills. After completing the 
classroom phase, students may 
wear a cap or pin and begin the

Estate
Series

Planning
Beginning

"Estate planning is more than 
deciding which heir will receive 
each of your assets,” says Mrs. 
Robin Taylor. County Extension 
Agent for Bailey County.

"Every family and individual, 
young and old alike, faces many 
changes, w hen a death occurs in 
their family,” added the Exten­
sion Agent. "Controlling 
Change", is a new Extension 
letter scries available to Bailey 
County familes who want to plan 
or and decide what many of 
these changes will be.

Estate planning information on 
w ills, Texas probate law, estate 
inventory, federal estate and 
state inheritance taxes and o- 
ther important planning point­
ers will be covered in this 
four-part series, with the first 
mail-out being on Monday, De­
cember 6.

Mrs. Reuel Kirby, chairman of 
the Extension Family Living 
committee reported, "We are 
offering this free letter series 
because we realize that every

family wants to do everything 
possible to make life for heirs as 
stable as possible after a death
occurs.”

Anyone may enroll to receive 
the letter series by calling 
806-272-3913 or writing to the 
County Agent’s Office, Court­
house, Muleshoe, Texas 79347. 
So notify the Agent's office now 
so you won't miss any of the 
letters, concluded Mrs. Taylor 
and Mrs. Kirby.

final phase ot 40 clock hours a 
week in an area hospital. Stu­
dents will be rotated through 
the various hospital depart-

Cont. on Page 2, Col. 1

Emergency 
Loan Funds 
Available

Emergency loan funds are 
available from the Farmers 
Home Administration county 
office in Muleshoe for farmers 
and ranchers, according to John 
C. Kennedy, county supervisor.

Kennedy said the loans were 
authorized following a request 
from the Bailey County Com­
missioners Court. The request 
came as a result of drought that 
cut crop production severely, 
especially in the southern part 
of the county.

Applications for emergency 
loans for physical losses must be 
filed by December 30, 1976. 
This deadline applies to farmers 
who were unable to plant their 
crop due to drought.

Applications for emergency 
loans for production losses must 
be filed by July 29. 1977.

Tom Lobaugh Named 
Local Postmaster
After several months of wait­

ing for official word, Tom Lo­
baugh. who has served as 
assistant postmaster for Mule- 
shoe for the past two years, was 
notified he was Muleshoe's new 
postmaster, effective Saturday, 
December 4.
He and his wife, Anita, moved 

from Littlefield to Muleshoe two

NEW POSTMASTER . . .  As Mrs. Lobaugh, left, looks on, Tom Lobaugh, center receives the keys to the 
post office from Otis McMillan, postmaster at Farwell. McMillan has acted as officer in charge for the 
post office in Muleshoe since the death of longtime postmaster. Spencer Beavers, in June. Lobaugh was 
named postmaster and assumed his official duties on Saturday. December 4.

years ago. where he had been 
employed by the post office 
there since 1957. A native of 
Olton, Lobaugh said he looked 
forward to giving Muleshoe the 
best possible mail service and 
would appreciate input from 
local residents as to what they 
would like to see for service 
improvements.

“ We will be changing where 
necessary to improve service," 
he added. "This is now my 
home, and 1 would like to say 
that my entire family likes living 
here."
Since Postmaster Spencer 

Beavers died on June 4, officer 
in charge has been Otis McMil­
lan, postmaster from Farwell. 
At the time he came to Mule­
shoe McMillan said he expected 
to be in Muleshoe for only three 
to four months.

"I have enjoyed working in 
Muleshoe," said McMillan, 
"And have appreciated every­
one being so cordial to me while 
I was working here. 1 have had a 
good working relationship with 
all the personnel here at the 
post office, the townspeople and 
think Muleshoe will have a good 
postmaster in Tom Lobaugh." 
The new postmaster and his 

wife have four children, Larry, 
who is 20, and stationed with 
the U.S, Marines in Santa Ana, 
Calif.; Jackie, 17, a senior at 
Muleshoe High School; Rebec­
ca, 12, a sixth grader and Bettie 
Ann, nine, a third grader. They 
•re also grandparents. Their son) 
Larry, and his wife, Debbie, arc 
the parents of two year old 
Brian.
The Lobaughs are members of 

the First Assembly of God 
Church in Muleshoe.

1976 Citizens Of Year 
Named During Breakfast

* * *  * * *  Green, Harris Share
Health Meeting 1976 Chamber Honor
Planned Monday
It was announced this week 

that South Plains Health Sys­
tems will hold a public meeting 
at the Muleshoe High School 
cafeteria on Monday, December 
6, at 7 p.m., according to 
Marshall Cook, board member.

’The purpose of the meeting 
will be to give the people of

Local  J a y c e e  
B rea k fa s t  
Begins Hunt

To get pheasant hunters off to 
a good start, the Muleshoe 
Jaycees will host a pheasant 
hunt breakfast from 6-7:30 a.m. 
on Saturday, December 11, the 
morning the pheasant season 
begins in this county.

They will feature all you can 
eat for $2 each at the American 
Legion Hall in Muleshoe. And, 
they said you don’t even have to 
be going pheasant hunting in 
order to come by and eat 
breakfast with the Jaycees.

Bailey County an opportunity to 
discuss the quality and availabi­
lity of local health services with 
members of the Health Planning 
team from South Plains Health 
Systems, a designated health 
planning agency for the federal 
government.

"Using the information gather­
ed during the meeting here and 
at similiar meetings held 
throughout the South Plains, the 
Health Planning team will for­
mulate a regional plan for 
improving public access to good 
health care here on the South 
Plains," emphasized Cook, who 
is also administrator of West 
Plains Medical Center in Mule­
shoe.
Cook went on to make clear the 

role of local citizens in the 
health planning process: “ We 
must speak up and make known 
the needs of our area.
“ Otherwise, our community 

could be overlooked by the 
Regional Health Services plan. 
Bearing that point in mind. I'm 
Cont. on Page 2, Col. 4

During the first two presenta­
tions, it was "Citizen of the 
Year", but this was changed 
Thursday morning when two 
people were named "Citizens of 
the Year” for Muleshoe. Chos­
en for the honors were Earl 
Harris, longtime Muleshoe resi­
dent and owner and operator of 
Western Auto Store, and Doro­
thy Green, widow of the late Dr. 
L.T. Green, Jr.
Making the presentation to 

Mrs. Green for the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture was Marshall Cook, 
administrator of West Plains 
Medical Center. He told the 
group at the breakfast of Mrs. 
Green’s role as a volunteer 
worker for the Muleshoe Hospi­
tal and Nursing Home Auxili­
ary, and cited her more than 
2,500 hours as a volunteer 
worker at the hospital complex, 
and that she is presently serving 
as president of the Auxiliary. 
Cook said that for the past 

several years, Mrs. Green had 
provided a rent-free building for 
the Hospital Auxiliary Thrift 
Shop.
Mrs. Green helped organize 

the Muleshoe Youth Center in 
1960 and still serves on the 
board in an advisory capacity 
and is a member of the mental 
health-retardation board of the 
High Plains Mental Health- 
Mental Retardation Center at 
Plainview. Dorothy Green is

New Insurance  
For County  
To Be Effect ive

Meeting in regular session on 
Thursday, December 2, mem­
bers of the Bailey County Com­
missioners Court paid routine 
bills and handled several items 
on the agenda.

Meeting with commissioners 
was Marvin Harvey, Blue Cross 
Insurance representative. He 
told commissioners the new 
insurance for the county would 
be effective on January 1, 1977. 
Commissioners also approved 

a transfer of $10,000 to each of 
the four road and bridge pre­
cincts from the Road and Bridge 
General Fund.

Discussed was the heating and 
cooling system at the Bailey 
County Law Enforcement Cen­
ter.
An inspection by a heating and 

cooling system specialist show­
ed the system to be adequately 
installed, although adequate 
routine maintenance was need­
ed. The specialist also suggest­
ed that all thermostats be put 
under lock and key in the 
building to protect the system.

also a longtime Sunday school 
teacher at the First Baptist 
Church in Muleshoe.

She and the late Dr. Green 
were the parents of two daugh­
ters and two sons, and she has 
five grandchildren.

Mrs. Green was told the Cham­
ber of Commerce wanted her to 
make the presentation to the 
"Citizen of the Year” in order 
for her to attend the breakfast 
without knowing she was to be 
one of the two honorees.

Harmon Elliott of Frist Nation­
al Bank made the "Citizen ol 
the Year” presentation to Earl 
Harris, who shared the “ Citi­
zen” honors this year. He told 
how Harris and his wife, Fay- 
rene, moved to Muleshoe in 
1955 when he opened Western 
Auto Store. Harmon also told of 
expansion for the store, and 
lauded Harris for his civic 
activities during the 21 years he 
has been a resident of Mule­
shoe.

Elliott cited Harris’ many years 
with the Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce and his service as a 
Muleshoe City Council member 
from 1960-62 and service on the 
Chamber of Commerce Board of 
Directors in 1960-62 and again 
in 1974-76. "He didn't come on 
time when there was something 
to do," said Elliott, "He was 
always early and more than 
willing to do his part, then 
some.”
Active in Rotary since moving 

to Muleshoe, he has served as 
president, vice president, secre­
tary. and treasurer of the club. 
He has attended the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Muleshoe for the past 20 years, 
and has served as president of 
its Methodist Men and chair­
man of its official board.
He and his wife are the parents 

of three children and have five 
grandchildren.
On this, the third year of the

annual presentation, the double 
honors were designated. The 
first “ Citizen of the Year” 
award was given R.A. Bradley, 
parts manager of Fry & Cox, 
and the second presentation was 
to Rev. H.D. Hunter, Jr., pastor 
of the First Assembly of God 
Church.

Some 70 people attended the 
breakfast, with Bob Finney, 
Chamber of Commerce Direc­
tor, acting as Master of Cere­
monies.

The breakfast meeting was 
closed by President Ted Barnhill 
expressing his appreciation to 
the people who attended, and 
making brief comments on up­
coming events.

TEACHING CLASS . . . Burt Sinclair, Trooper II for the Texas
Department of Public Safety, completed a Defensive Driving Class 
at the Muleshoe Volunteer Fire Department this week. The school 
w as sponsored by the fire department and approximately 30 persons
attended.

School Bonds 
At Lazbuddie 
( id  A Bating

Follow ing a trip to New York to 
meet with Moody's bond rating 
firm. Superintendent of Lazbud- 
dic Schools Sam Barnes report­
ed a verv successful meeting.

The $575,000 Lazbuddie ISD 
building bonds received an ‘A’ 
rating, for the most excellent 
rating a bond issue can receive.

Making the trip were Superin­
tendent Barnes, financial advis­
or Bob Davis of Underwood, 
NewhausA Co.. Inc. and School 
board members. President Al­
fred Hicks, Marvin Mimms, 
Gene Paul Jarman, Chunk 
Smith and Jerry Don Glover. 
Not making the trip were Jim 
Roy Daniel and Dcrrcll Jen­
nings.

Davis estimated a savings of 
from $25,000 to $35,000 for the 
school district because of the 
rating received.
The Lazbuddie School Board 

will open and award bids sale of 
bonds for construction of new 
facilities at the school during a 
special meeting of the board at 4 
p.m. on Monday, December 6. 
Bids are being received, said 
the superintendent, until 2 p.m. 
at the Security State Bank in 
Farwell on the date of the 
special meeting.

SANTA’S HELPERS . .  Busy placing Muleshoe'* official Christmas tree at the Mule Memorial last week 
were workers from Bailey County Electric Cooperative. In the baskets are Bob Hardaway and Philip Wilcox 
Making adjustments from the base of the tree is 'Joel Sinclair . Bailey County Electric traditional 
installs the tree following Thanksgiving, and do it as a public service to local citizens.

»
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Shop By Mail, But Caution Urged
“ Thumbing through a sales 

catalog, choosing merchandise 
and dropping an order in the 
mail can be fun and an easy way 
to Christmas shop," according 
to Muleshoe Postmaster Ton* 
Lobaugh.

“ Most mail order firms rely on 
repeat business and usually 
provide fast shipment and quali­
ty merchandise. That's good 
business," he said.

"However,” Postmaster Lo- 
baugh warns, "if you order 
merchandise by mail and must 
wait a long time to receive it or 
never get it at all -  that's bad 
business.”

Postmaster Lobaugh points out 
that a Federal Trade Commis­
sion rule now protects custo­
mers w ho order merchandise by 
mail. The rule gives customers:
— The right to know when to 

expect shipment of the mer­
chandise. For example, if an ad 
indicated a "rush" shipment in 
less than a week, the manufac­
turer must do so within that 
time. If no date is stated, the 
items must be shipped within 30 
days.
-- The right to cancel the order 

when shipment is not made 
within the stated time or the 
maximum 30-day period. The 
firm must indicate the delay and 
provide a free means for the 
customer's response, such as a 
postage-paid postcard. Custo­
mers may cancel the order or

agree to the new shipping date.
-- The right to receive a refund 

when canceling an order be­
cause shipment cannot be made 
within the prescribed time peri-

Nursc
Cont. from Page 1

ments, such as medical and 
surgical nursing, maternity and 
newborn nursing, pediatrics and 
administration of medicines.

Entrance requirements, in ad­
dition to the aptitude exam, 
include two years of high school 
or the equivalent, a complete 
physical examination within six 
months prior to admission, per­
sonal interview with vocational 
nursing personnel, moral integ­
rity, references and a definite 
interest in nursing.

Average
A citizen is a man who 

demands better roads, big­
ger schools —and lower 
taxes.

-Lumberman, Nashville.

Dear Santa.
I want a bike and a Lone 

Ranger with Silver. I will put a 
glass of milk and some cookies 
out for you. Thank you very 
much. God bless all the children 
in the world.

Guy Dale 
Age 6 

First grade
* * * * *

Dear Santa Claus,
My name is Carey. I want a 

B.B. gun. A powerful one to and 
with a scope and a pistol and the 
pistol will shoot B.B.s and my 
B.B. Gun to. And I will put some 
cookies and milk out for you. 

* * * * *
Dear Santa,
I am two years old. Please 

bring me a city with matchbox 
cars, a cowboy to go on my 
pretty horsy, and a strctch-your- 
armstrong. I am the baby, 1 
have two brothers. Thank you 
and Merry Christmas.

Love, 
Gared Dale

* * * * *
Dear Santa,

1 love you Santa. 1 am 7 years 
old - in the second grade at 
Richland Hills. 1 want a big Jim.
I want a Walkie-Talkie. I love 
you Santa. I want a Mr. Spock. I 
want a Stretch Armstrong also. 1 
want a Tin Can Alley too. Santa 
I have a 6 year old brother who 
has tried to be good so please 
answer his letter.
Love,
Toby

* * * * *
Dear Santa.
I am 6 years old and I'm in the 

first grade. Santa - I want a Lone 
Ranger and I want a Stretch 
Armstrong. I want a Evel Kniev- 
el Stunt Cycle and car. 1 want a 
Tin Can Alley and Robot. Santa 
Please bring some for my 7 year 
old brother and mv Mama and 
Daddy. O K.
Love,
Killv

od. The seller must mail the 
refund within seven days after a 
customer cancels. If there is a 
credit sale, the firm has only one 
billing cycle to make the proper

Dear Santa Claus,
I want a train, a play horse, 

and a cowboy, and baby goat, 
and a little dog.

Love,
Eliberto

* * * * *
Dear Santa,
I want a tree house,and a 

roll-over Baby doll, and a Baby 
doll that goes in the bathtub. 
And a doll that has diapers. 
Love. Michelle Cox 

* * * * *
Dear Santa Claus,

I want a Ballerina Barbie for 
Christmas and the Jaws game, 
and that's all.

Love,
Tonya Sisemore

* * * * *
Dear Santa.

Please get me a Tender-Love 
and that's all. Please get my 
little brother a Teddy Bear and a 
John Deere tractor. That’s all. 

Love, Channia Pierce 
* * * * *

Dear Santa Claus,
Please bring me a racing bike 

and a gun.
Love Ramon Sanchez 

* * * • •
Dear Santa Claus,
I want a gun, and a car, and a 

toy rabbit.
Love,
Ricardo Alarcon

* * * * *
Tear Santa.

I want Baby-Alive and Barbie.
Love,
Norma Anguiano 

* * * * *
Dear Santa Claus,
I want a bike, and a swing for 

my baby brother, and a big bike 
for my big brother, a set of 
bowls for my mother.
Love, Maria Germain 

* * * * *

Dear Santa Claus,
My name is Steve Stancell. I 

have two more brothers, their 
names are Carey and Kyle. I’m 
the oldest. I'm nine years old. 
Carey is 7 and Kyle is 4. For 
Christmas I want a calculator. 
Carey doesn't want me to write 
this letter. Kyle wants a bicycle. 
All of us have been pretty good 
boys.

* * * * *

adjustment to the customer's
account.
The rule, however, does not 

apply to the following mail order 
services: phot finishing; maga­
zine subscriptions; serial (more 
than one) deliveries except for 
the initial shipment; seeds and 
growing plants; COD (collect on 
delivery) shipments; and credit 
orders where the customer's 
account is not charged prior to 
the merchandise shipment.

When dissatisfaction occurs 
and the mail order company 
does not comply with the rules, 
the customer should contact the 
firm at once. If no results follow, 
two courses of action may 
follow, said Lobaugh.

If the customer feels the com­
pany has not fulfilled its obliga­
tions under the Federal Trade 
Commission rule, a short letter 
-  outlining all of the circum­
stances -  should be mailed with 
a copy of the ad to: Director, 
Bureau of Consumer Protection 
(MO-P), Federal Trade Com­
mission, Washington, DC 
20580.

"On the other hand," Post­
master Lobaugh said, “ when 
customers feel that they may 
have been victims of a mail 
order fraud or believe that the 
Postal Service may help resolve 
a dispute with a company, they 
should immediately contact lo­
cal postal officials at Muleshoe.

"We are interested in protect­
ing the public from promoters 
who exaggerate in their adver­
tisements and try to erode 
confidence in shopping by mail, 
especially at Christmas time.” 
Lobaugh concluded.

The Scientists Tell Me... 
Turfgrass Litter Can Help 
Control Turf Diseases

Health...
Cont. from Page 1

asking everyone I see to attend 
that meeting on Monday 
night.”

He also reminded that good 
health and good health planning 
are the business of everyone, 
and that input from everyone is 
most important in order to 
acquire the best in health servic­
es for local residents.

The earth travels around the 
sun at a speed of 1,100 miles 
per minute.

Out of Town, Out off CashOut off Luck...
not with BanClub CheCash

‘Say Chock Cath

Sign Up First National Bank 
Muleshoe, Texas

First National Bank
___________________________ MEMBER FDIC_________________________

By Robert L. Haney 
T A E S  Science Writer

Did you know turi'giass 
litter that builds up on tin- 
soil surface sup p o rts  
thousands of different kinds 
of m icroorganism s which 
decom pose the litte r and 
suppress turf diseases:'

A ccording to Dr. Phil 
Collxmgh. plant pathologist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Experiment Station (TAES) 
at Dallas, turfgrasses have a 
unique microbiological de­
fense system which protects 
against many diseases attack­
ing them.

Most diseases of turfgrass 
are caused In fungal patho­
gens which feed on both liv­
ing and dead plants. Fungi 
w hich cause Fusarium  
b lig h t, leafspot, brow n 
patch, and Pythium blight 
are common examples. This 
group ol fungal pathogens 
largely relies on turflitter for 
survival when it is too cold, 
hot. w et or dry for rapid 
growth. The litte r is also 
used in the production of 
spores or fungus threads by 
which the diseases spread.

The accum ulated  litte r  
w hich su rro u n d s the  
turfgrass plant consists of 
grass c lipp ings, dead  or 
dying lower leaves, stolons, 
rhizomes, roots and tillers 
which are in various stages of 
decomposition.

M icroorganism s w hich 
decompose litter not only 
compete with fungal patho­
gens for available food but 
also produce  com pounds 
which suppress the growth 
of pathogens. Litter decom­
position is mostly done by 
bacteria ; how ever, m any 
beneficial fungi are also p re­
sent on litter, especially du r­
ing advanced stages of de­
composition.

Colbaugh cautions against 
excessive buildup of grass 
c lipp ings. R esearch has 
shown that turfgrass c lip ­
pings which are added to the

Bailey County Journal

litter during mowing greatly 
favor disease increase.

Colhaugh explains that at 
the  tim e ol m owing, 
turfgrass clippings have a 
high con ten t of available 
nutrients and low numbers 
of beneficial microorganisms 
needed to suppress fungal 
pathogens. Collection of turf 
clippings during ‘he growing 
season prevents excessive 
buildup of litter which favors 
disease.

T em p era tu re , m oisture 
and a continuous supply of 
available nutrients are im­
portant factors which regu­
late disease development on 
turfgrasses and suppress lit­
ter microorganisms. There 
are many exam ples of 
turfgrass diseases which are 
started during periods o fen ­
v ironm enta l ex trem e  or 
when too much or too little 
fertilizer is applied.

For exam ple, sum m er
disease problems are com­
mon on closely clipped turf 
or where temporary drought 
conditions allow turflitte r to 
dry . Colbaugh s research has 
show’ll that the activities of 
litte r m icroorganism s are 
greatly red u ced  w ithou t 
moisture. But, several turf 
pathogens grow readily on 
d ried  litte r  im m ediately  
alter remoistening.

Colhaugh considers dry­
ing and rewetting of litter to 
be a major factor favoring 
disease activity on turf dur­
ing the summer. Turfgrass 
also becomes increasingly 
susceptible to disease when 
under water stress. Drought 
aids the developm ent and 
spread of disease on turf.

R esearch shows that 
proper irrigation is neces­
sary to maintain an active 
microdefense system on lit­
ter and a vigorous stand of 
tu rf  d u rin g  the  sum m er. 
K eeping  tu rfg rass litte r  
moist allows continuous ac­
tivity of beneficial litter mic­
roorganisms. This doesn’t 
mean that turfgrass should 
be kept sopping wot because 
this would favor certain fun­
gal pathogens. A well d< 
veloped turf cover will main­
tain litter in a moist condi­
tion for a long period while1 a 
thin cover will lose- moisture 
quickly.

Increasing the mowing 
height of tu rf  during the 
summer months helps con­
serve m o istu re  in litte r.

Colbaugh s research shows. 
The frequency and amount 
of water applied to a lawn 
should he based on the exist­
ing s tru c tu re  o f the tu rf  
canopy . For a lawn with a 
dense canopy , once-a-week 
deep watering may be suffi­
cient to keep both the soil 
and litter moist. For a lawn 
that is thinned out, several 
sho rt m orning  w aterings 
may he necessary, in addi­
tion to the weekly deep wat­
ering to keep both the litter 
and the soil moist.

The timing of watering of 
tu rf can help reduce disease 
activity, according to Col­
baugh. The practice of early 
morning w atering allows the 
turf foliage to dry quickly. 
W atering of tu rf during the 
evening or at night usually 
keeps the foliage moist for 
long periods and creates a 
very favorable environment 
for d isease ac tiv ity  by 
turfgrass pathogens.

C u ltu ra l p rac tices  d e ­
signed to keep litter decom­

posing microorganisms vig­
orous have proven helpful in 
the suppression  of many 
fungal pathogens on turf. 
Future research will look for 
additional triggers of fungal 
pathogens on turfgrasses. 
These studies will enable 
plant scientists to propose 
other cultural practices for 
turfgrass based upon an un­
derstanding of how common 
turf diseases can be naturally 
suppressed.

Editor's Sote - Any ques­
tions regarding this column 
should he addressed to Sci­
ence Writer, Dept, o f Ag­
ricultural Communications, 
Texas AOM University, Col­
lege Station, Texas 77843.

GOVERNMENT ORDER
American Telephone Si 

Telegraph Co. has been 
ordered by the government 
to file within eight months 
new rate schedules for 
some of its  specialized 
services.

Plains Cotton Growers, Inc., Lubbock-based cotton pro­
ducer organization, is urging a “yes” vote in the cotton re­
search and promotion referendum.

Ballots for the long-awaited referendum will be in the mail 
to cotton producers on December 8. They must be returned 
to county Agricultural Stabilization and Conservation offices 
with a postmark no later than midnight December 17.

The vote is on amending the Cotton Research and Promo­
tion Act which currently authorizes the collection of $1 per 
bale to finance the research and market development work of 
Cotton Incorporated. If producers approve, the dollar-a-bale 
collection will rise in 1977 to $1 plus four-tenths of one per­
cent of the cotton’s value.

W.B. Criswell of Idalou, cotton producer and current PCG 
President, strongly favors passage of the referendum, as does 
the entire 50-man PCG Board of Directors.

Additional funding for Cotton Incorporated is needed for
two reasons. Criswell notes.

First, Cl will no longer be getting from $3 million to S10 
million a year in federal funds as it did for the years 1972 
through 1976, he explains, and second, inflation has reduced 
the buying power of the dollar by about 40 percent since the 
rate was set in 1966.

“Cl has put new and improved cotton products on the 
market,” Criswell points out, “and these products plus Cl’s 
advertising and promotion programs have stopped the decline 
in cotton’s share of the textile fiber market for the first time
in 20 years or more.”

Now, he continues, “we must put up money to retain and 
extend our gains. Otherwise the synthetic giants will start to 
gobble up our markets again.”

Passage of the referendum will mean that cotton producers 
in 1977 will be investing something like twice as much in 
Cotton Incorporated as in 1976.

“But this investment is a part of the cost o f doing business," 
Criswell concludes, "and it is every bit as important as the 
investment in fertilizer or herbicides or irrigation water, be­
cause we can’t stay in business if there is no market for our 
production."

This phone manufactured by American Telecommunications Corporation 

Touch Calling or dial models available to match service m your area

UVALT OISNEY PRODUCTIONS

Give the world's most lovable phone 
this Christmas!

Now Mickey Mouse stars in a fabu­
lous new role; a real, real phone. Pure 
Disney from his tweaky nose to his 
squeaky toes. Each one is individually 
numbered-a collector's item everyone 
can own. Hurry and order the world's 
most lovable gift now. We don't have all

that many. Call our business office for 
all details.

THE M ICKEY MOUSE PHONE
(The Mickey Mouse housing is owned by ( Q Q 9 5
you but the working parts remain ours ****#• 

so il there s a problem, we ll fix it.)
O ptiona l paym ent p lan * available
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Health Resources 
Plays Detective
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Detective work is supposed to 
be the special province of the 
police •• but it's a part of the 
everyday routine at the Texas 
Department of Health Resourc­
es. Every time the state's public 
health agency receives a serum 
or tissue specimen from a 
physician, hospital, or local 
health facility, it’s up to the 
technicians and scientists of the 
Bureau of Laboratories to deter­
mine what diseases, if any. the 
specimen reveals.

About one and three-quarters 
million laboratory tests are per­
formed each year by the depart­
ment’s central laboratories in 
Austin, and another one and a

quarter million are done by the 
24 regional laboratories around 
the state. In the past year, such 
major health problems as bru­
cellosis. St. Louis encephalitis, 
tularemia, rabies. Rocky Moun­
tain spotted fever, and leptos­
pirosis have been detected 
through standardized laboratory 
procedures — along with more 
routine, but equally serious, 
ailments such as influenza and 
venereal disease.

This amount of work, and its 
quality, may be surprising to 
many people. But in profession­
al circles, the state health 
department’s laboratory is con-

Texas
Taxe$

By BOB BULLOCK, State Comptroller

AUSTIN-As you probably 
know, this office recently 
released its formal estimate of 
the amount of money that 
will be available to the 1977 
Texas Legislature for writing 
a new two-year budget.

Overall, the projections are 
rosy. We anticipate that the 
new Legislature will have 
additional $2.9 billion to 
work with, 34 percent more 
than was available to its' 
predecessor in 1975.

There have been some 
misconceptions about what 
this office really means when 
it makes revenue estimates, as 
required by law. We are 
simply estimating how much 
money the State will be 
bringing in—its’ income—over 
a given period and how much 
it will spend.

You do about the same 
thing, but on a much smaller 
scale, when you figure the 
family budget.

Now, we are not—and 1 
want to repeat ‘not’—saying 
that the 65th Legislature will 
have $2.9 billion more to 
spend. We are simply saying 
that much more money will 
be available.

What is done with the 
money is a Legislative matter. 
It can be used for new 
program s or to expand 
existing ones. Or, as some 
leaders are advocating, we 
might set aside a little for a 
rainy day-a suggestion I 
personally like. Some of it 
could even be returned to 
Texans through tax cuts.

We have a number of ideas 
about what we think ought to 
be done with the money--but 
that is not our job. Our job is 
to collect money, not spend 
it.

The fact that our revenue 
estimate was released just 
before Thanksgiving day was

purely coincidental. But I 
think it was appropriate 
because it reminds us again 
that we have a lot to be 
thankful for in Texas. Most 
of our sister States have not 
been as fortunate.

The statistics tell the

Alan Lovelace, Deputy 
Administrator on NASA 
on a second joint U.S.- 
Soviet space flight.”  
“ There’s a need for a 

great deal of d e t a i l e d  
study to be undertaken 
before any comment could 
be made.”

B I B

story. Sales tax collections 
are up a whopping 17 percent 
over last year, far above the 
n a tio n a l average. Motor 
vehicle sales tax collections 
are up 33 percent and the 
franchise tax is up 28 
percent.

What it all adds up to is a 
sound  S ta te  econom y. 
Businesses are expanding. 
Texans are making more 
money and they’re spend me 

m ore , dem o n stra tin g  a 
renewed confidence in the 
future.

I hate to sound a sour note 
at this point, but I think it’s 
in order. Planning is as 
essen tia l for tim es of 
prosperity as it is in times of 
crisis. Common sense tells us 
that the current revenue 
boom can’t last forever.

It is essential that the 
Legislature keep this in mind 
when it convenes in January 
as its decisions will have a 
p ro found  effect on the 
State's future.

I’ve said it before, and I’ll 
say  i t  a g a in : Unless 
precautions are taken this 
State will be facing in the 
future-perhaps 1979, perhaps 
later—the biggest tax bill in 
its’ history.

It’s as sure as the feathers 
on a hen’s back.

IF YOU HA YF ANY  
STATE TAX PROBLEMS 
OR QUESTIONS, CONTACT 
Y O U R  L O C A L  
COMPTROLLERS FIELD 
O F F I C E  OR  
T O L 1. - F R 
I -800-252-555.5.

C A L /.
E E :

sidered one of the best in the 
country.

In fact, the central laboratory 
in Austin has recently been 
licensed by the national Center 
for Disease Control, in Atlanta, 
Georgia, under the provisions of 
the Clinical Laboratories Im­
provement Act of 1967. It’s one 
of only two state laboratories in 
the nation that have met the 
strict guidelines for licensure.

Charles E. Sweet, chief of the 
Bureau of Laboratories, points 
out that the CDC licensure is not 
required of the Texas laboratory 
because specimens ar not ship­

ped across state lines. However 
Dr. Sweet -- w ho is a Doctor of 
Public Health -- said, “ It seem 
ed appropriate to me to volun 
tarily accomplish this step for 
professional standing. There is 
no reason why some indepen 
dent and hospital laboratories 
should face mandatory stan 
dards more strict than those 
which we voluntarily meet. I 
don’t think we should do any 
thing less than other laborator 
ies in having top quality.” Dr 
Sweet added. "Now we can say 
to any laboratory, ’We have 
done no less than you in

meeting good laboratory stan­
dards’."

Meeting those standards, Dr. 
Sweet explained, involved the 
entire laboratory, including in­
struments, personnel, preven­
tive maintenance, testing of 
procedures by outside sources, 
the references used in tests, and 
the rewriting of manuals. The 
manuals contain detailed in­
structions for each of the dozens 
of laboratory procedures used to 
detect various diseases.

"Just rewriting the manuals 
was a tremendous task," Dr. 
Sweet said. "But knowning this

is behind us and that it was 
something needing to be done 
was very rewarding to all of the 
staff."
The Bureau of Laboratories 

contains ten separate branches, 
three of which -  clerical servic­
es, scientific services, and the 
Laboratory Improvement
Branch -  serve as resources to 
the other seven. Those include:
* Environmental Chemistry, 

which is concerned with the 
safety of drinking water and 
wastewater.

* Clinical Chemistry, which 
handles blood testing primarily

for the medical screening pro­
gram for children whose fami­
lies receive welfare assistance.

* Biological Production, which 
manufactures vaccines against 
diphtheria, tetanus, pertussis, 
typhoid, smallpox, and some 
other diseases.

* Serology, which performs 
tests to detect antibodies in 
human blood as evidence ol 
infection caused by specific 
organisms.

* Virology, which detects all 
types of viruses.

* Parasitology, which identifies 
parasites such as worms and

amoebas.
* Bacteriology, which is con­

cerned with bacterial diseases 
such as gonorrhea, tuberculosis, 
strep throat, and various food- 
borne diseases.

Dr. Sweet, although obviously 
proud of the laboratory’s ac­
complishment, says that there’s 
no time for resting on laurels -- 
especially since there will be a 
"surprise inspection" by a CDC 
inspector sometime during the 
coming year. Meanwhile, Dr. 
Sweet says, "We'll be looking 
continually for areas of improve­
ment. We’re never satisfied."

LUKE PURCy S£Z ME 
STUDIED ANATWAtf 
x r k  S O N E IH IA J'IW T  
UX*5 0OOD ON 6IRLS.

J U S T  $5...

M r  m

w i t h  a n y  $ 2 5  p u r c h a s e  o f  M e r l e  N o r m a n  
c o s m e t i c s .  R x i r  o f  o u r  m o s t  e x c i t i n g  n e w  
f a l l  i t e m s  a r e  p a c k e d  i n  t h e  m o s t  v e r s a t i l e  
p u r s e  y o u ’ ll e v e r  o w n !

A  g r e a t  g i f t  i d e a .  R > r  y o u r s e l f . . . o r  
f o r  s o m e o n e  a l m o s t  a s  n i c e !

m ERLEnoRm flncosm ETics
Merle Norman Studio

HILLTOP PLAZA SHOPPING CENTFR 
CLOVIS N.M

7 6 2 - 1 8 4 8

Vaff-n-Sserz
fc. REAL VALUES IN FLAVOR

RM  R O A S T

Lb.

E X T R A L E A N  FOR STEW

Beef Cubes S 1LB . 1 ”
BEEF C ENTER CUT

Chuck Roast , 8 9 *
T EN D ER IZE D

Beef Cutlets
W R IG H T ’ S F L A V O R W R iG i r r

*1
LB . ■

49

218 ' 
R O IL

8 O Z .  
P K G .

1

7 9 *
OSCAR M A Y E R  R E G ., B EEF, G A R L IC , S Q U A R E m  a

Sliced Bologna 8pk°gzo 9 c

$ 1 49

Pork Sausage
OSCAR M A Y E R  SLICED CHEESE &

Bologna

OSCAR M A Y E R  R E G U LA R  O R  BEEF

Variety Pale
H ILLSH IR E FA R M S  R EG . O R  A L L  BEEF

12 OZ 
P K G .

BEEF B LA D E C U T

CHUCK £ A c  
ROAST ,  0 7

FRESH G U A R A N T E E D  LE A N

GROUND £ A (  
BEEF , 0 7

BEEF

ROUND $  1 
STEAK ,  I

1 09
EXTRA LEAN

G R O U N D  O A C  
BEEF O V

f  S l t d f  S p e c i a l  ^ IN QUARTERS , m m

A M E R IC A N  B E A U T Y  IN P O LY  B AG

Elbo Roni t o  o z .  O Q c 
b a g  m

DEL M O N TE W HOLE

Green Beans O  303 ^  1
W  C A N S  I

LA D Y  SCOTT

Facial Tissue O  2 0 0 C T .$  1  
A h  B O XES I

Margarine 1 LB. 
PKGS.

| Wesson Oil
J  $ 1 5 9

W P  4bu I

SHURFINE

S U G A R
H e M  And Beauty Aidb 5 LB. BAG 8 9 *

D E O D O R A N T  S P R A Y  30‘ OFF LA B EL

SECRET

99*c a n  A m

S J axweu

ALL GRINDS COFFEE

M A X W E L L
C O U G H  SU PPRESSANT

4 Hour Hold

"
COf ttt-1

HjiklHOUSE
SOFLIN ASSORTED

P A P E R
TOW ELS JUMBO

ROLL

G nocfity  S p e c i a l
F A M IL Y  S C O n  ASS OR TED B A T H R O O M

Tissue

Dial Soap
BOW WOW

Dog Food

2 9 *

8 9 *

HEINZ WITH BEANS OR PLAIN

Chili Fixin's

1 59*
V aiiy And Ftojew Feed

SHURFINE FROZEN PRE-COOKED

_FISH STICKS
Mm  79<

L U N C H E O N  M EA T

D EL M O N T E

wit Cocktail

-39*
ARMOUR 
TREE! « 89

<P« 14 0Z
PKG

M IN U T E M A ID  F R O Z E N  a

Orange Juice O

H U N T ’ S T O M A T O

T A N G E R IN E S
M IN A  DE 0R0”

iCoKWi-wi -
STAMP BONANZA

FLORIDA 
LARGE SIZE

C A LIF O R N IA  V IN E R IP EN ED

Tomatoes
PAP ER  SHELL

Pecans

PRICES
EFFEC TIV E
DECEM BER

6 - 11,
1976

$ 1 2 9

LA R G E H E A D

Lettuce ___ 3 ™  S 1
YELLO W  SWEET

Onions 2 , 2 5 *

QUALITY AND SERVICE

MULESHOE, TEXAS
515 W. AMERICAN BLVD. PHONE 272-4406
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Miss Minckler Weds 
Ray Eads

MRS. F. RAY EADS

Hootens Honored On 
Silver Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Hooten 
were honored on their Silver 
Wedding Anniversary with din­
ner in Lubbock, Saturday eve­
ning, November 27.
Hosting the occasion were 

their children, Gary of College 
Station; Mr. and Mrs. Kerry 
Wagnon of Canyon; Lary of 
Muieshoe and Mrs. Hooten's 
mother, Mrs. Mcrvin Wilter- 
ding. Others attending were 
Robert’s mother, Mrs. Cleo

McNabb and his sister and her 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. M.M. 
Barefoot, all of Mesa, Ariz., and 
Miss Hollye Crinshaw, Snyder, 
Texas.

Surprising the Hootens after 
dinner, a tiered wedding cake, 
topped with the bride and 
groom adorning their cake 25 
years earlier and again used in 
1975 on their daughter's wed­
ding cake, was served with 
coffee and punch in the horn eof

Mrs. Wilterding. Gifts were 
presented to the honorees.
The former Maurine Wilter­

ding and Robert Hooten were 
married November 22, 1951, in 
the YL Methodist Church. Ro­
bert and Maurine moved to 
Muieshoe from Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma in 1954 and became 
engaged in farming. Presently 
they are owners and operators 
of Muieshoe Motor Company.

The First Methodist Church of 
Texline was the setting for the 
wedding of Miss Sherri Jean 
Minckler an F. Ray Eads on 
Wednesday, November 24.Mike 
Scott, minister of the Texline 
Church of Christ, read the vows 
for the double-ring ceremony. 
The bride is the daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. R.K. Minckler, 
Sr., of Muieshoe, and the groom 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Bernard Eads of Texline.
The couple stood before an 

altar of blue candles and baskets 
of yellow and white gladiolas 
trimmed with blue ribbons. The 
selection of wedding music was 
rendered by Mrs. Cecil McClel­
land, pianist, and Cecil McClel­
lan, soloist. Selections were 
“ We’ve Only Just Begun", 
"Twelfth of Nover” , “ Wedding 
Prayer" and "Wedding Song” . 
The bride, escorted and given 

in marriage by her father, was 
attired in a floor-length gown of 
bridal satin with French lace 
overlay on the bodice and 
sleeves. The train of French lace 
was attached to the soft bow at 
the back waist and flowed to an 
edge of scalloped lace. The 
headpiece was a crown of lace 
and seed pearls with a veil of 
layered finger length net. The 
wedding dress was made by the 
bride. The bride’s bouquet of 
yellow and white daisies and 
white carnations with baby’s 
breath, was attached to a Bible 
which had been carried by her

Country Bakers  
H o ld  Meet ing
The “ Country Bakers” met 

Tuesday, November 30, in the 
home of their project leader, 
Mrs. Eugene Shaw, for their 
final cooking lesson.

They planned a dinner follow­
ing the Daily Food Guide and 
then cooked the meal.

Food Show plans were discus­
sed. Each member discussed 
what they would enter. 

Members present were Dennis 
Snell, Trent Hysinger, Jason 
Scoggin, Darin Shaw, Steve 
Griswold, Preston Scoggin and 
Curtis Snell.

mother at her wedding. The 
bride also carried an Irish linen 
handkerchief with crocheted 
lace which belonged to her 
great-great grandmother.
The matron of honor, Mrs. 

Richard Minckler, Jr., sister-in- 
law of the bride, wore a floor- 
length gown of blue polyester 
knit. The bridesmaids. Miss 
Sarah Espcset, of Dallas, and 
Mrs. Richard Guynes, Here­
ford, wore floor-length gowns of 
yellow polyester knit. The flow- 
ergirl, in a blue gown, was 
KaDonna Pittman, the bride’s 
cousin. The candlelighters were 
Dean and Gene Pittman, twin 
sons of Mr. and Mrs. Robert L. 
Pittman, Amarillo, also cousins 
of the bride.

Best man was Walt Eads, 
brother of the groom. Grooms­
men were Richard Valouche, 
Texline, and Robert Valouche, 
Amarillo. Todd Minckler, ne­
phew of the bride, was the 
ringbearer. James Burns and 
Sam Lamb of Texline, were 
ushers.
A reception was held at the 

church following the ceremony. 
The bride’s table was covered

with a blue cloth, blue candles, 
bouquets of daisies and carna­
tions. A three-tiered wedding 
cake completed the setting. The 
groom's table was covered with 
a yellow cloth and silver service.

Serving from crystal appoint­
ments were Miss Kathy Eads, 
sister of the groom, Mrs. Gary 
Syaloy, Miss Crystal Carter and 
Miss Carol Williams, all of 
Texline. Registering at the re­
ception was Miss Lee Stribbing.
Out-of-town guests were Dr. 

and Mrs. G.A. Pittman, grand­
parents of the bride; Mr. and 
Mrs. R.K. Minckler, Jr. and 
Todd of Lubbock; Howard 
Minckler of Dallas; Mr. and 
Mrs. R.L. Pittman, Dean, Gene 
and RaDonna of Amarillo.
The bride's traveling outfit was 

a blue five piece suit, which the 
bride made, of blue polyester, 
carrying out the bride’s colors.

After the wedding trip to Eagle 
Nest, New Mexico, the couple 
will be at home in Texline.
The bride is a 1972 graduate of 

Muieshoe High School and a 
1976 graduate of West Texas 
State University. She is employ­
ed as the third grade teacher at 
the Texline Elementary School.
The groom is a 1976 graduate 

of West Texas State University 
and is employed as an automo­
bile mechanic.

DONATION TO HOSPITAL ACTION FUND . . . Shown above are 
Mrs. John Blackwell, president of the ESA sorority, Mrs. Andy 
Douglass, treasurer of the sorority and Mrs. Wiley Moore, 
secretary-treasurer of the Action Fund Committee. Mrs. Moore 
accepted a check in the amount of SI 105 that was raised by the 
sorority November 20, at the radio station by auctioning homemade 
baked goods. This is the third year the project proceeds were given 
to the Hospital Action Fund bringing the sum total donated by the 
sorority to $3500. All money raised has been designated to be used 
to furnish the new nursery of the hospital.

Muieshoe S tu d y  Club Meets

Mrs. Terry Sowder 
Feted With Shower
Mrs. Terry Sowder of Bula was 

honored with a lullaby shower 
Tuesday, November 30, in the 
home of Mrs. Bennie Claunch.
The serving table was laid with 

white lace over yellow, with an 
.arrangement of fresh yellow 
daisies. Yellow punch, coffee, 
along with white cake squares, 
nuts and pineapple chunks were 
served by the hostesses.
The honoree, her mother, Mrs. 

Louis Kuehlerof Bula, and Mrs. 
Bill Sowder were presented 
corsages of baby socks to wear 
during the afternoon.

Special guests for the occasion 
were the honoree's mother, her 
sisters, Mrs. Debbie Rice and

Life’s hardest task: liv­
ing each day by the Gold­
en Rule.

Mrs. McDonald TOPS 
Queen Of The Week

The TOPS Club met Thursday, 
December 2, in the Bailey 
County Electric Cooperative 
Room. Mrs. Dan C. Vinson was 
in charge. Thirty members were 
present. This is a record number 
of members present at one 
meeting for 1976. One renewal 
was Mrs. Acension Garcia. 
Mrs. J.J. McDonald drew Can- 
Can.
TOPS Queen of the Week was 

Mrs. J.J. McDonald. First run­
ner-up was Mrs. J.O. Parker 
and second runner-up was Mrs. 
Glen Splawn.

A report was given on last 
week’s meeting. Twenty-one 
members were present. Queen 
of the Week was Mrs. Ed Harp. 
First runner-up was Mrs. Reta 
Hill and second runner-up was 
Mrs. Dura Vinson. The Novem­

ber Queen of the Month was a 
tie between Mrs. Harvey Whit- 
tenburg and Mrs. Ed Harp. 
First runner-up was Mrs. Janie 
Patton and second runner-up 
was Mrs. Reta Hill.
TOPS Recognition went to 

Mrs. Mae Province and Mrs. 
Louis Shafer.
The meeting was closed with 

the good night song.

i=^ tr-p r a

The first president to be mar­
ried while in office was John 
Tyler, our 10th president, on 
June 25. 1844.

PALI PLAIDS MAKE A PANTSUIT. D G'i seporotes 
in o delicote lovely yellow double knit polyester coordi­
nate for a charming suit. The jocket has unusual 
v-shaoed pockets the pants match the finejine plaid 
and the shell is solid yellow # J 07I. Jacket #1004. Pants

#6925. ShellCM J  DEPARTM ENT STORE
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This is the Viking 6440 sewing machine. 
It s what I want for Christmas because: 

(check in red ink)
□  I love the way it sews.
□  consumer surveys love it.
□  it s so reliable and uncomplicated
□  it will give me more time to spend 

with you.
/ want to
□  make racy negligees and 

slinky dresses.
□  darn your socks
□  sew all the kids' clothes.
□  do crafts and embroidery
□  sew leather and vinyl.

□  make you a nylon tent, down jacket 
and sleeping bag.

□  sew drapes and upholstery
□  make shag rugs fast

□  You’ll never get a better price, 
especially with my trade in.

□  I'll never need another one as 
long as I live.

□  I deserve it.

As long as you're in the car, here’s 
where you can oyl a demonstrationand vinyl. ... where you can gel a demonstTatioi

w m m
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Mrs. Betty Lyons of Morton, 
and Mrs. Bill Sowder of Bula. 
The honoree was assisted in 

opening her gifts by her mother 
and Mrs. Sowder, while her 
sister, Mrs. Rice, registered the 
gifts in the baby book.
The hostess gifts to the hon­

oree were crib sheets, bed 
bumpers, snuggle pillow and 
comforter.

Hostesses for the occasion 
were Mrs. Bennie Claunch, 
Mrs. Loyd Pollard, Mrs. Robert 
Claunch, Mrs. Buck Medlin, 
Mrs. l.L. Clawson, Mrs. Dewitt 
Taylor, Mrs. Wanda Legan, 
Mrs. Myrna Turney, Mrs. Tom 
Newton, Mrs. R.T. Newton, 
Mrs. Dennie Turney and Mrs. 
Cecil Jones.

The Muieshoe Study Club met 
in the home of Mrs. Mervin 
Wilterding for their November 
meeting. Mrs. Levina Pitts was 
co-hostess.

Prayer was held by Mrs. 
Horace Blackburn and the 
Pledge of Allegience by Mrs. 
J.G. Arnn. A short business 
meeting was conducted by Mrs. 
Mildred Neely.
Mrs. Wilson Witherspoon gave 

a program on “ Dreams of 
American Ideals". She brought 
notations on the life of President 
Gerald Ford and then some 
information on the life of Presi-

In countries where an 
afternoon siesta is part of the 
daily routine, avoid going to 
sleep immediately after a 
heavy meal. Nothing adds 
weight so speedily as a two- 
hour s iesta  a fte r a big 
luncheon.

dent-elect Jimmy Carter. 
Members present were Mrs. 

J.G. Arnn. Mrs. Horace Black­
burn, Mrs. Joe Costen, Mrs. 
Lewis Embry, Mrs. Rufus Gil­
breath, Mrs. Ed Johnson, Mrs. 
T.L. Kent, Mrs. Mildred Neely, 
Mrs. Doyle Turner, Mrs. Wilson 
Witherspoon, Mrs. Mervin Wil­
terding and Mrs. Levina Pitts.

West Plains 
iMedicalCenler

Briefs

Piano Workshop Held

A
MISS REGINA POTEET

R e g in a  Potee t  
I n i t i a t e d  In 
Alpha  Chi
Two students at West Texas 

State University from Mule- 
shoe, have been initiated into 
the Texas Zeta chapter of Alpha 
Chi, national honor society.

Initiated in recent ceremonies 
were Regina Poteet, daughter of 
mr. and Mrs. George Poteet and 
Sammye Henderson, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Mardis.

“ Induction into Alpha Chi is 
reserved to those juniors and 
seniors of good character who 
rank in at least the upper tenth 
of their classes,” Dr. Martha

Mrs. Sam McKinstry attended 
a piano workshop on Tuesday, 
November 30, at the Phillips 
House of Music in Clovis, N.M.
David Carr Glover conducted 

the workshop. Glover is known 
for the fine music he writes. 
This workshop was excellent for 
teachers who are just beginning 
to teach piano.

To the some 30 or more 
teachers from the surrounding 
areas who were in attendance, 
each was presented two books. 
The first was "The Adult Piano 
Student" and the second book

was “ David Carr Glover Piano 
Library" a complete course of 
study including “ David Can- 
Glover Program for Adult Stu­
dents", "Sacred Music Piano 
Library", "Entertainment Se­
ries", “ Group Piano Library", 
"Program Solo” and "Ensem­
ble Series” .

After the workshop, a luncheon 
was held by Mr. and Mrs. 
Phillips and the teachers were 
able to select music for their 
students.

ADMISSIONS
November 29 - Christine How­

ard. Tom Ammons and Carol 
Kennemer.
November 30 - Jovita Ponas. 

Larry Flowers, Toni Eagle. Don­
na Wood, Lea Lindeman and 
Berlin Harvey.
December 1 - Jill Actkinson, 

Forrest Greene and Ruby Lam­
bert.

December 2 - R.L. Hobbs.
December 3 - Billie Walden 

and Francis Witherspoon. 
DISMISSALS
November 30 - Wilford Boren, 

Myrtle Welch and Mary Jane 
Sparlin.

December 1 - Carol Kennemer, 
Beulah Gatewood, Jovita Porras 
and baby girl.

December 2 - Toni Eagle and 
baby boy. Donna Wood, and Lea 
Lindeman and baby girl.
December 3 - Earl Ware and 

Berlin Harvey.

One thing that fiction 
often has on life is  the 
happy ending.

Head, associate professor of 
physics and chapter sponsor, 
said.

Associate sponsors are Kath­
leen Collins, assistant professor 
of English and David Lasher, 
assistant professor of mathe­
matics.
Organized in 1922, the Texas 

Zeta chapter of Alha Chi is one 
of 152 chapters in 39 states.

The average human body con­
sists of about 50 trillion cells!

Theory is  all right for 
the books, but it takes 
practical expression of 
ideas to make life better.

OPEN HOUSE 
Sat., Dec. 11

[10% Discount^
On A n y  

Christmas  
Purchase
Come By Any Time 

And Register For

FREE
Christmas Arrangement

To Be Drawn For 
Saturday Afternoon.

QiccowLou 216 ~}loul

• •

616 5. 1st 272-4340

Gifts For All Occasions
^  Frankoma Pottery

Mak es The Perf ect

Gi f t  For M o t h e r s ,
Or The Upcomi ng Bri de.

■IMCD CMMSm sn We A h o  H n v e^  W e d d i n g  A n d  •A n n iv e r s a r y  I n v i t a t i o n s,
B r i d e  Books, Guest Books, P h o to  A lb u m s , 
A n d  Napkins .  Come In Now!

i/O itlu m i ' B t u .  O ^ t i e  S u p p l y

322 M a in  
, •

•o*' .© SL
272-3113
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FOOD ROOKIES . . . Lazbuddie 4-H Good Rookies are visiting the local Cashway grocery store to learn 
first-hand about the uses of food. Shown are back row, left to right: Lori Ivy and Maureen Jesko; Middle 
row , L to R: Vandi Tarter and Stacy Ivy; Front row, L to R: Mrs. Pete Jesko, Lisa McGehee, Sue Collins 
and Jana Rogers. Not pictured is Tina Collins.

Lazbuddie L-II Rookies Study Basic Four
Eight Lazbuddie 4-H Food 

Rookies have been learning how 
to choose foods their bodies 
need each day and how to 
prepare some of these foods.
Taking part in this program are 

Lisa McGehee, Vandi Tarter, 
Sue Collins, Stacy and Lori Ivy, 
Jana Rogers, Tina Collins and 
Maureen Jesko. They have been 
meeting in the home of their 
adult leader, Mrs. Pete Jesko.
On Monday, November 22, the 

group learned how to measure 
liquid and dry ingredients ac­
curately. Dry measuring cups 
were used to measure flour after 
it was sifted. Mrs. Jesko showed 
how much more flour would 
have been used in the Butter­
scotch Brownies they prepared 
and baked, if flour had not been 
sifted before measuring. Brown 
sugar was firmly packed for 
measuring in the dry measuring 
cups.

Liquids were measured in 
glass liquid measuring cups so 
that the accurate amount could 
be seen at eye level. Standard 
measuring spoons were used to 
measure the baking powder and 
leveled off with a knife.
The 4-H Food Rookies studied 

the Four Basic Food Groups 
which include fruits and vegeta­
bles, breads and cereals, milk 
and meats. On Tuesday, No-

"M

ventber 23, they planned menus 
for a day that would include all 
of these food groups.
These girls learned that a 

menu should be appetizing by 
including a variety of colors, 
shapes, textures, flavors, and 
temperature of foods. They also 
learned to consider foods eaten 
away from home, family favor­
ites, seasonal foods, and foods 
to fit the family budget in 
planning family meals.

Nutrients of the foods are most 
important so that the body can 
grow properly and stay healthy. 
Foods in the fruit and vegeta­
bles group help your body 
provide for healthier skin, eyes, 
hair, gums, red blood and body 
cells. Breads and cereals supply 
the body with fuel for energy, 
help in digestion and repair 
body cells. Milk provides calci­
um for growth and unkeep of 
teeth and bones, protein for 
building and repairing body 
cells and tissues. The meat 
group plus eggs, fish, dried 
beans and peas, and nuts cont­
ain protein for building new 
body cells and repairing old 
ones.

Tuesday, November 30. the 
Lazbuddie 4-H Food Rookies 
visited a local grocery store 
where they observed different 
foods fresh, frozen and canned.

After the shopping tour the girls 
discussed where foods should 
be stored to prevent food spoil­
age Und food poisoning.
The 4-H Food Rookies discus­

sed the best place to learn and 
practice table manners is at 
home. Some simple rules to 
follow to help make mealtime a 
happy time arc: be relaxed, eat 
slowly, quietly and neatly, talk 
about happy things, listen to 
others talk, eat the meal with 
the family together, rest elbows 
to your sides, place used flat- 
ware on plate and keep criticism 
of food to yourself.
These 4-H girls were part of 

the Parmer County 4-H Goods 
Show held Saturday, December 
4, in Friona.

Heath D ’Wayne
Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Eagle of 

Earth are the proud parents of a 
new baby boy born November 
30, at 1:50 p.m. at West Plains 
Medical Center. The baby 
weighed seven pounds and 
three ounces and was named 
Heath D’Wayne.
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. T.C. McWilliams of Mule- 
shoe and Mr. and Mrs. J.B. 
Eagle of Earth. Great grandpar­
ents are Mrs. Eura McCool of 
Arlington, Mrs. Henry Grady 
Eagle of Earth and Alton Ray of 
Muleshoc.
Brandy Lea
Mr. and Mrs. Russell Lee 

Lindeman of Friona are the 
proud parents of a new baby girl 
born November 30, at 4:28 p.m. 
at West Plains Medical Center. 
The baby weighed five pounds 
and fourteen ounces and was 
named Brandy Lea. She is the 
couple's second child. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. C.B. Looper, Sr. of Friona 
and Mr. and Ms. Homer Linde­
man of Friona.
Mari  be I Hernandez
Mr. and Mrs. Cruz Porras of 

Bovina are the proud parents of 
a new baby girl born November 
30, at 10:25 a.m. at West Plains 
Medical Center. The baby 
weighed seven pounds and five 
ounces and was named Maribel 
Hernandez.

H ome Im p ro vem en t  Loans  
Easier  To Obtain
COLLEGE STATION -- 1 he

new "retail philosophy’ among 
bankers may help homeowners 
weigh the pro's and con’s of 
remodeling.

Bankers are more eager to 
make home improvement loans 
than any other type of consumer 
loan. Sue Young, a housing and 
home furnishings specialist, 
says.

"Home improvement loans

NEW TASKS AHEAD . . . Being pledged into the new job of Den Mothers are from left to right: Mrs. 
Mike Pugh, Mrs. Max King, Mrs. Jerry Ruthardt, Mrs. Joe Ed Brown. Mrs. Lupe Regine and Mrs. Rudy 
Gonzales.

Love  Still  Impor tan t  In M arr iage
COLLEGE STATION - The

most happily married people are 
those who love each other 
deeply. No one ever hears of a 
really loving couple talking a- 
bout the possibility of separa­
tion and divorce, Dorthy Taylor, 
a family life education special­
ist, points out.

"What many people call love 
today is just sexual attraction. 
Married love is far more than 
that; it includes the feeling you 
have for a close and dear 
companion with whom you 
share part of your life — the 
friendship love. It includes the 
desire to cherish, help and care 
for the one you love — like the 
tender protective emotion you 
feel for a child. It includes 
willingness to sacrifice yourself.

if need be, for the loved one."
She noted that marriage is 

more than two people in love, 
though. It is also two people in a 
partnership. The partnership^ 
must work if the marriage is to 
be happy.

"It isn’t enough for a husband 
to be able to tell his wife in 
glowing terms how beautiful she 
is and how much he loves her. 
He must be able to provide her 
with a home, bring in a steady 
income, manage the family’s 
business affairs, deal with the 
children, organize outings and 
vacations and do the odd jobs 
around the home.

"The wife, too, has to be more 
than an adorable sweetheart. 
She must be a comrade to her 
husband, a housewife, a mana­

ger of money, a mother to her 
children, the family representa­
tive in many social events in the 
community, and perhaps an 
auxiliary breadwinner," the 
specialist pointed out.

And it takes quite a talented 
person to be really good at all 
those things. Miss Taylor point­
ed out.

“ Two things are especially 
important in enabling a couple 
to work out a good partnership. 
The first is adaptability in both 
of them; the second is a sound 
workable policy for decision 
making.

cost less to service (the average 
loan has doubled during the last 
10 years) and losses are less. 
Also, bankers realize that when 
a home improvement loan is 
made they have a better chance 
of obtaining a family's checking 
and savings account as well as 
making loans in the future,” 
this specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, 
The Texas A&M University 
System, says.

“ The family with a good credit 
raiting and an income sufficient 
to support the loan has greater 
leverage to bargain for better 
terms. This family is in a 
position to negotiate for a lower 
interest rate and a longer term 
loan. It is advantageous to talk 
with several bankers in order to 
obtain the most favorable 
terms.”
A recent Federal Trade Com­

mission ruling, known as the 
holder-in-due-course, provides 
another indirect benefit to 
homeowners, the specialist 
said.

"If financing for a remodeling 
project has been arranged by 
the contractor with a lending 
institution, the borrower can 
stop payment on the improve­
ment if he is not satisfied with 
the goods or services. This also 
applies to other consumer loans.

"Consequently, lenders are 
more selective of contractors 
they work with. It is to their 
advantage to finance reputable 
contractors. When fly-by-night 
contractors cannot obtain fi­
nancing, the homeowner will 
benefit in the long run," she 
pointed out.

“The line that is straightest 
offers the most resistance."

Leonardo Da Vinci

I IWANTED
Hungry People

FREE-FREE-FREE

Coffee Break

9 t o l l  — 2 to 4 
Wednesday  Dec. 8th

HATTIE KINARD
New Owner 

&
AH New Employees

T X m m  'Q t t t  'K tiU u M tti

| 2103 Amer.B lvd.  272-3460
I ^ o o o o o g o o o o o o c o o c o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o I

See Yourself In 
Fxeiting Fashions For

The Holidays From 
Our Selection Of:

Countess Custom 
Donovan
Preception

Red I
Jim & Me
& Others

W e  Welcome Ba nkam er ica  C a rd  

A Master  Charge

Open Ever y Mo n d a y  N i g h t  
Unt i l  9 p . m .  D i f f e r e n t  Specials

Each M o n d a y  N i g h t .

Cuwd Hook
Bee Hive Mall

W endy Jo
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Knox are 

the proud parents of a new baby 
girl born November 27, al 8:55 
p.m. at University Hospital in 
Lubbock. The baby weighed six 
pounds and fourteen ounces and 
was named Wendy Jo. Grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. R.B. 
Knox of Sudan and Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Smith of Melrose, 
N.M. Great-grandmother is 
Mrs. Daisey Ford of Sudan.

Leslie D e a n ne
S/Sgt. and Mrs. Gordon R. 

Graves of Ft. Sill. Okla. are the 
proud parents of a new baby girl 
born November 10. The baby 
weighed seven pounds and four 
>unces and was named Leslie 
Oeanne.
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Vlrs. Bud Graves of Sudan and 
Mrs. Domitela Zillanueva of 
Burlington, N.J., and Luciano 
Aquilae of Panama City, Pana­
ma. PORTABLE INCUBATOR . . . Shown above are L to R: Mrs. Pete Jesko, Mrs. Arnald Alcorn. Mrs. J.C.

Feagley, Mrs. Harry Waddle, Mrs. B.A. Dearing, and Mrs. Mattie Hicks, R.M., Director of Nursing at
West Plains Medical Center. These women are members of St. Mary’s Circle of Immaculate Conception 
Catholic Church of Muleshoc, and have recently donated U> West Plains Medical Center a portable 
incubator used to transport infants. The hospital had been bbrrowing an incubator from Friona.

Jimmy Carter, President­
elect:

Rookie Cooking Croup Meet
<4I d o n ’ t c la im to  k n o w

a ll th e  a n s w e r s . . . but
I ’ m n o t a fr a id  to ta k e  on
th e p r e s id e n c y o f th e
U . S r e n i g t h
c o m e s  from  y o u , th e p e o -
p i e . *»

Democracy
A democracy is u coun­

try in which everyone has 
an equal right to feel su­
perior to the other fellow.

-Telegram, Worcester.

PABLO MENDOZA. J K .

Mendoza Named To Who’s 
Who At West Texas State

Pablo Mendoza, Jr., son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Pablo Mendoza, Sr. of 
Lazbuddie was one of 49 West 
Texas State University students 
named to Who's Who Among 
American Universities and Col­
leges. The students were select­
ed from 160 nominations for 
their scholarship, leadership, 
involvement in campus life and 
potential for future achieve­
ment.

Mendoza, a graduate biology 
major, is a member of Alpha Chi 
National Honor Society, Beta 
Beta Beta Biology Honor Socie­
ty, the American Chemical Soci­
ety, Psi Chi Psychology Honor 
Society and W.T. Karate Club. 
He has also been active in 
Student Hall Government and 
has been elected as vice presi­
dent, treasurer, and Faculty 
Sponsor in the last few semes­
ters.

Mendoza was a dormitory ad­
visor for two years and has been 
a Residence Hall Director for 
the last three years. In May ol 
1976, he was honored with a 
plaque in recognition for his 
service to dormitory life.

In addition to his academic 
accomplishments, Mendoza has 
been involved in several other 
extracurricular activities. He 
has been certified as an Operat­
ing Room Technician and has 
had some experience in this 
field. He was also a member of a 
biological expedition to the Yu­
catan Peninsula and served as 
interpreter. Mendoza, partici­
pated for three years in the art 
of Kung-Fu having received 
private instructions from a Ko­
rean instructor.

Mendoza is married to the 
former Merced Puente of Mule- 
shoe.

The Rookie Cooking group of 
Progress 4-H met November 9, 
in the home of Mrs. Billie 
Downing.
The girls divided into three 

groups to prepare hamburger 
pinwheels. tater tots and choco­
late pudding. They learned to 
make marshmallow flowerettes 
to garnish their individual pud­
dings.
Those present were Laurey 

Grant, Susan Lunsford, Renae 
Snell, Becky Mardis, Dorinda 
Shafer, and Twila Downing. 
Also leaders, Mrs. Kay Mardis 
and Mrs. Billie Downing.

HAMBURGER PINWHEELS 
Vi cup minced onion 
*/« cup chopped green pepper 
Vi cup chopped celery 
2 Tbsps. fat

Saute onion, pepper and celery 
in fat in covered saucepan. 
ADD:
1 lb. ground beef or chopped 
chicken
1 tsp. salt 
dash pepper
Vi cup fine bread crumbs 
Vs cup milk
Cook over medium heat until 

meat is cooked, not dry. 
BISCUIT DOUGH.
2 cups sifted flour
3 tsps. baking powder 
1 tsp. salt
Vi cup cooking oil 
Vs cup milk
Sift dry ingredient together 

into bowl. Pour oil and milk into 
measuring cup, without stirring. 
Then pour all at once into flour 
and stir with fork until mixture 
cleans sides of bowl.
The roll into Vi” or Vs” thick

"Learn a new language and get 
a new soul." Czech Proverb

rectangle on waxed paper. 
Spread hamburger mixture on 
biscuit dough. Roll lengthwise 
as for jelly roll, wetting edge to 
seal. Cut 12 slices, place cut 
side up, on greased baking 
sheet.
Place in hot oven and bake 20 

minutes.

Hobby  Club 
P la n sC h  ris tmas  
P a r ty
The Muleshoe Hobby Club met 

at Muleshoe State Bank Com­
munity Room Thursday, Decem­
ber 2, with Mrs. Ethel Julian as 
hostess and Mrs. Bub Shafer as 
co-hostess.
The meeting was called to 

order by Mrs. Ola Epperly, 
president. Mrs. Opal Robison 
made roll call and gave the 
business report.
Articles shown were pillows 

wall plaques, pot holders, mac 
rame, picture frames, fruit jar 
doll clothes, afghan, needle 
point picture, hot place mat 
macrame Christmas tree deco­
rations.
The Christmas party for Mule­

shoe Hobby Club will be Friday, 
December 16. Gifts will be 
exchanged among members. 

Members present for the meet­
ing were Mrs. Ola Epperiey, 
Mr.s Opal Robison. Mrs. Dora 
Phipps, Mrs. Mabel Oaldwell, 
Mrs. Mae Loyd, Mrs. Allie 
Barbour. Mrs. C.E. Briscoe, 
Mrs. Sammie Ethridge, Mrs. 
Bernice Amerson, Mrs. Ruth 
Bass. Mrs. Bub Shafer. Mrs. 
Ethel Julian and Mrs. Levina 
Pitts.

Earth 257-33I3!

IN C A S E  Y O U  H A V E N ’T  H E A R D  . . .

THERE’S SOMETHING NEW 
AT MULESHOE STATE BANK!
It’s called our Ready Bank!! Cur bank within a bank. Ourautomatic 
teller machine lets you bank anytime—day or night. Your key to 
24-hour banking is waiting for you at Muleshoe State. Come in, 
make your application for a Ready Bank card and with that card 
and your personal code number, you can set your own banking 
hours.

MULESHOE
aflfrl STATE BANK

M e m b e r  FD IC 272-4561
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Increase Profits With Pump Repair
Repairing worn irrigation 

pumps is a profitable move, 
according to U.S. Department of 
Agriculture researchers.
Research on a well at Texas 

A&M University Research Field 
at Etter proved this beyond a 
doubt. Having pumps in good 
repair was good business before 
high priced energy, but is now a 
necessity say Dr. Arland Schnei­
der, Agricultural Research Ser­
vice Engineer, and Dr. John 
Shipley, Texas Agricultural Ex­
periment Station Economist, 
from the USDA Research Center 
at Bushland. They carefully 
measured pump efficiency and 
cost and found that replacing a 
worn-out pump bowl assembly 
decreased electricity cost from 
$22.48 to $15.69 per acre-foot. 
Calculations showed that reduc­
ed electricity cost will pay for 
the repairs in the 1977 pumping 
season.
The old pump at the Etter 

Research Field was installed in 
1964, and pumped 1,000 gallons 
per minute until 1972. Then it 
started pumping erratically and 
dropped to 500 gallons per

minute by 1976, according to 
Dr. Shipley.
That was not enough water to 

carry out experiments at the 
Research Field. Rather than just 
change the pump, Shipley took 
the problem to Dr. Schneider. 
They decided to do a thorough 
study on the pump to determine 
both energy cost and efficiency 
of operation. With good infor­
mation in hand, the scientists 
could then calculate the profita­
bility of making repairs.
The worn-out pump produced 

500 gallons per minute, and 
lifted water 290 feet, but the 
pump operated at only 49 per­
cent efficiency. Installing the 
new pump bowl assembly in­
creased the pumping rate to 750 
gallons per minute. With a 
higher pumping rate, drawdown 
increased and total lift was 325 
feet. Under these conditions, 
pumping efficiency was increas­
ed to 79 percent.

Repairs cost $3,228.00, but the 
scientists figured that repay­
ment would take only 143 days 
of pumping. "High Plains farm­
ers irrigating both wheat and 
sorghum pump more than this

in one season," Dr. Shipley 
said.
The researchers point out that 

water cost can be calculated 
rather easily. Pumping rate, 
energy consumption, and ener­
gy cost must be known or 
determined. Accurate pumping 
rates can be measured with an 
inline propeller-type meter. Wa­
ter meters can be equipped with 
quick couplers and placed any­
where in a surface irrigation 
pipe. The meter records the 
number of gallons of water 
passing through the pipe. Keep­
ing records for one hour gives 
an accurate output for a well. 
"A meter costs about $400.00 
but would be a good invest­
ment," Dr. Schneider says. 
"Knowing the amount of water 
being applied to crops is just 
good business,” he continued. 
Keeping track of natural gas or 
electrical energy use for at least 
two hours on company meters 
gives an accurate measure of 
energy consumption The cost of 
fuel or electricity must be known 
also. An acre-inch of water is 
27,000 gallons. With these fi­
gures in hand, a little arithmetic

gives the cost of an acre-foot of 
water.
The following calculations 

were made by Schneider and 
Shipley before repairing the 
well at Etter. It took 64.8 
kilowatt hours of electricity to 
run the pump one hour. Electri­
city costs 3.2 cents per kilowatt 
hour. Multiplying the two fi­
gures gives a pumping cost of 
$2.07 per hour. At 500 gallons 
per minute, the well produced
30.000 gallons an hour. Dividing
27.000 into 30,000 gallons shows 
that the well pumps 1.11 acre- 
inches per hour. Water cost per 
acre-inch is $2.07 divided by 
1.11 or $1.87. Multiplying $1.87 
by 12 shows that cost per 
acre-foot of water is $22.44.
Calculating pump efficiency is 

more complicated and the two 
scientists suggest obtaining out­
side help. Reputable pump re­
pairmen can calculate efficien­
cies and suggest proper pumps 
for each motor and well. Pump­
ing efficiency is related to 
electricity use, pumping rate, 
and total dynamic head. The 
latter is the sum of w ater lift and 
any pressure required to move

water above ground. High pres­
sure is needed to run sprinkler 
systems. Water lift or pumping 
depth is measured with an 
electric water level probe cost­
ing about $100.00.
The scientists remind farmers 

that properly operating pumps 
can make the difference be­
tween profit and loss. It takes 
two acre-feet of water to pro­
duce about 7,500 pounds of 
sorghum. They figure that pay­
ing $30.00 for energy to pump 
the water is a lot better than 
paying $45.00.

RANGE MANAGERS TO
DISCUSS LEGISLATION

Legislation affecting the range 
and livestock industry will re­
ceive major emphasis during the 
annual meeting of the Texas 
Section of the Society for Range 
Management at Texas A&M 
University, December 3-4. 
Speakers will also deal with the 
current situation in the sheep, 
goat and range cattle industries, 
managing Klcingrass, control­
ling fire ants, managing wildlife 
habitats, grazing woodlands, 
managing ranges with fire and 
managing university lands.

The
Consum er
A lert

by John L. Hill 
Attorney General

A U STIN -Those after- 
Thanksgiving Day sales can 
provide some tempting price 
reductions on the winter coat 
you’ve been admiring since 
late last summer.

If you’ve managed to wait 
this long, chances are you can 
find a price that’s within the 
limit you have set for your 
purchase. But can you find the 
quality of coat you need and 
want?

Our Consumer Protection 
Division lawyers say that a 
winter coat is likely to be your
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most expensive clothing buy. 
so it pays to be careful and get 
your money’s worth, since 
even with special sales it’s still 
going to cost you a lot.

Textile experts and fashion 
designers agree on one point: 
you should buy the very best 
fabric, the simplest style, and 
the most durably made coat 
you can find. Forget about the 
“latest look.” It’s much better 
to invest in a well-made, 
classic style cloth coat than to 
put the same amount of money 
into a “high fashion” look, a 
“fun” fur, or a fur-trimmed 
coat. You generally get what 
you pay for-and if you pay for 
this year's style, you can 
almost bet that you’ll have to 
sacrifice some quality in 
material and tailoring.

Besides, if you buy this 
year’s “Cossack” look and next 
year’s fad is the “cowboy” look, 
your expensive coat will 
immediately begin to look 
dated. Good construction, 
material, and style will insure 
that your coat wears as well 
and looks as good in several 
years as it does when you buy 
it.

Here's a few things to check 
when you go coat-shopping:

-If you choose a plaid, stripe, 
or other design, be sure the 
design is matched at seams. 
-The coat should be cut with 

the grain of the fabric. 
Buttonholes, too, should be cut 
with the grain, so they won’t 
stretch.

•The simpler the better as 
far as enduring style is 
concerned, but if trim or 
decoration is included, be sure 
it's a compatible fabric that 
won’t fade or bleed, and be 
sure it's firmly sewn.

-Linings should require the 
same care as the fabric, be of a 
matching color, be of good 
quality material, tightly sewn 
and firmly attached to the 
coat.

-Zippers, buttons, hooks 
and eyes, grippers, and any 
other fasteners should be 
securely sewn and should 
match the fabric in color. 
Zippers, in addition, should 
work easily, be smooth and 
flat, and be covered complete­
ly by a fabric flap.

-Buttonholes should be 
bound or stitched firmly with 
ends reinforced.

A n n o u n c in g  
Cl i f t o N Al l en 

Cvst om
S A D D L E  M A K E R

Hand Tooled Cut 
O ut N a m e  Belts

Com ole te 
Saddle  Repair

N * w  A Used  
Saddles  In Stock

1027 W. Amer. Blvd  
Ph. 272-4898

-Stitches should be straight, 
small, and secure. One rule of 
thumb is to have approximate­
ly 12 stitches to an inch.

-Seams should be generous 
enough to allow for later 
alterations if needed. Main 
seams should be pressed open 
and seam edges taped or 
stitched to eliminate fraying.

Our Consumer Protection 
attorneys caution you to make 
sure that required fiber 
content and fabric care 
information is attached to the 
coat. And be sure to find out in 
adi’ance the store’s policy on 
returns. Some sale merchan­
dise cannot be returned.

If you have a consumer 
complaint, get in touch with 
the A ttorney G eneral’s 
Consumer Protection Division 
or your county or district 
attorney.

Editor’s note: Following are 
representative questions an­
swered daily by VA counselors. 
Full information is available at 
any VA office.

Q -  Both my mother and father 
were veterans and both are 
deceased. I am drawing nonser­
vice-connected death pension 
from my father. Can I draw 
pension benefits from my mo­
ther also?
A -  If your mother had 

sufficient qualifying service, 
you are eligible to draw pension 
benefits from both simultane­
ously.

0  -- If a veteran has been 
receiving VA outpatient care of 
a service-connected disability, 
will the report of treatment be 
sent to the rating board for 
reevaluation without action by 
the veteran?
A -  Only if there has been a 

significant change in his physi­
cal condition in the judgement 
of the physician. Otherwise, the 
veteran or his representative 
must request records of treat­
ment be furnished the rating 
board.

Q -- My husband was killed in 
Vietnam, but his remains were 
not recovered. Is there any kind 
of marker available to be placed 
in the national cemetary located 
near his place of birth?

A -  A memorial marker or 
headstone may be furnished to 
the next of kin to commemorate 
any member of the armed forces 
who died in the service and 
whose remains were not recov­
ered or who was buried at sea.

0  -- What is the current 
interest rate on National Service 
Life Insurance policy loans?

A -  Five percent.

Q -  1 have an automobile in 
which the VA has installed 
adaptive equipment. If I subse­
quently purchase other vehicles, 
will the VA install equipment in 
them?

A -  Yes. However, adaptive 
equipment will not be provided 
for more than one conveyance at 
a time and for not more than 
three conveyances in a two-year 
period.

BLEAK RICE OUTLOOK
For rice producers looking 

toward 1977, the picture isn't 
bright, says an economist with 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service and the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Sta­
tion. Carryover from this year's 
crop is expected to reach about 
43 million hundredweights. Fur­
thermore, U.S. producers next 
year intend to plant some 500, 
000 acres more than the national 
allotment of 1.8 million acres. 
All this will continue to put 
pressure on rice prices.

f lnter -Am er icqnn te  r-M  m e  m
Lr^ora  torier scientific services for agriculture

"Com plete Consulting Program 
For A l l  C r o p s ” ;

Staff O f  24 Agronom ists  
Across 8 States.

Specia l ise  In: So i ls-Disoase-  
I nsects  8 Water M anagem ent.

Our  O w n  Complete Lab With The 
Most M od ern  equ ipment

Consulting S o rvico Consists Of:
1. Crop  Nutrition
2. Water M a na gem en ts  Training
3. Insects  8  D isease  Scouting

With W eek ly  Visits 
Contact:

Darre l l  Bryant  

1502 Mitchell, Suita 3 

Clovis, N.M._______Ph. 762-7831
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MARCUS BEVERSDORF TONY VELA DEAN NORTHCUTT

Mule All-District Trio Noted

Thespians have chosen three 
outstanding young men as stu­
dents of the week. They are 
Marcus Beversdorf, Tony Vela, 
and Dean Northcutt. All three of 
these athletes were chosen as 
members of the first string 
All-District Football team. 
Marcus Beversdorf is the son 

of Mrs. Bcrnie Beversdorf. He 
is a Junior and was chosen as 
All-District tight end. Marcus 
devotes much of his time to 
athletics. Marcus how holds a 
position on the Varsity Basket­
ball team.
Tony Vela is the son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Joe Vela. He is a Senior at 
MHS and was chosen as all 
district line backer. Tony is 
President of the Art Club and 
played diligently for the Mighty 
Mules.
Dean Northcutt is the son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward North­
cutt. He is a Junior and was 
chosen as All-District secon­
dary. He is a member of Student 
Council and FTA. He too dedi­
cates many hours to athletics 
and plays on the Varsity Basket­
ball team.
Thespians would like to con­

gratulate these young men on 
their achievements and hope 
that this is only the beginning.

High School 
HonOr Roll
Is Released

SENIORS
Laura Beene, Renee Douglass, 

Tammy Bruns, Tonya James, 
Sheryl Stovall. Connie Bruns, 
and Susan Puckett.
Also, Lena Gartin, Nancy 

Ramm, Rosita Quintana. Patty 
Pena, Curtis Reynolds, Lisa 
Mason, Robert Martin, and 
Karen Head.

JUNIORS
Connie Harmon, Cherylee Bry­

ant, Jana Jones. Stephanie 
Brantley, Mark Washington, 
Martin Nowlin, Jane Green, and 
Roycc Clay.
Also. Dewayne Shafer. Vicki 

Williams, Melody Mauldin. 
Frances Brown, Kirk Lewis, 
Curtis Carpenter. Cynthia Har­
ris, and Rhonda King.

SOPHOMORES 
Julia Shain. Jeep Shanks. 

Mark Harmon, Karen Stovall. 
Lavavne Lloyd. Stephanie Bell, 
Beverly Copeland, Debbie Hall, 
Troena Bass, and Chana Eu­
banks.

FRESHMEN
Tommy Wheeler, Shelley Sain. 

Scott Baker, Shelly Dunham. 
Robert King, Debra Stevens, 
and Sharia Henry.

We are proud of our three 
all-district selections and feel 
each selection was well deserv­
ed.

The Mules Basketball record 
for this season's games is 2-1. 
They have victories against 
Farwell and Tulia. and their one 
loss is to Hale Center.

In the game against Farwell 
Tuesday night. Brad Baker had 
two points; Jimmy Ybarra, two; 
Danny Wilson, seven; Charles 
Briscoe, two; Billy Vinson. 20; 
Mark Washington, four; Mike 
Wisian. four; Marcus Bevers­
dorf, nine; and Dean Northcutt, 
two. The final score was Mule- 
shoe 52. Farwell 51.
The members of the Muleshoe 

Mules Varsity are Seniors; Jim­
my Ybarra. Mike Wisian, Ro­
bert Brown, Randy Whalin, 
Kevin Smith and Ricky Hayes. 
The Juniors are Brad Baker. 
Danny Wilson, Doug Precure, 
Billy Vinson, Mark Washington, 
Marcus Beversdorf. Dean 
Northcutt and Curtis Carpenter. 
Sophomore Charles Briscoe also 
played for the Varsity against 
Farwell.

December 6 - 10 - 1076 
MONDAY
Milk
Tuna Sandwich
Vegetable Beef Soup
Sandwich Bread
Peanut Butter Confection
TUESDAY
Milk
Hamburger 
Lettuce and Tomato 
Pickles - Onions 
Tater Tots - Catsup 
Buns
Sliced Peaches 
WEDNESDAY 
Milk
Green Enchilada Casserole 
Green Beans 
Celery Sticks 
Sliced Dills
Lemon Pudding with Topping
Cornbread
THURSDAY
Milk
Hot Dog - Chili Sauce 
Vegetable Beef Soup 
Cinnamon Rolls 
Pear Half 
FRIDAY 
Milk
Chicken Pot Pic
Buttered Rice
Buttered Spinach
Jello Fruit Salad
Pineapple Upside Down Cake

Schorr refuses to reveal 
source of secret report.

Marcus Beversdorf was select­
ed as tight end. Tony Vela as 
linebacker and Dean Northcutt 
at defensive back. Since these 
selections are made by the 
opposing coaches in our district, 
this makes the selection a truly 
great honor. Again we want to 
congratu.ate Marcus, Tony, and 
Dean.
Also we have five players who 

made honorable mention. John­
ny Estep was named on offense; 
Curtis Carpenter, defensive 
back; Robert Brown, defensive 
back; and Robby Young and 
Kim Helker were the defensive 
linemen. Congratulations to 
these honorable mention play­
ers!

J V  P layers  
Star t ing  With 
W inning  Team
The J.V. Mules Basketball 

team started their season off 
November Id by beating the 
Tulia Hornets 64-49. On Novem­
ber 23. Hale Center traveled to 
Muleshoe with the final score 
57-53 with the Owls losing to the 
Mules. Tuesday night Novem­
ber 30, the Mules played the 
Farwell Steers beating them 
61-51. High pointed was Dennis 
Patterson w ith 12 points. Others 
scoring for the Mules were 
Charles Briscoe with 10 points, 
Terry Shafer with nine points, 
Dickey Sudduth with eight 
points. Mac Norman with eight 
points. Jerry Wheat with five 
points. Lary Hooten with four 
points. Jeep Shanks with three 
points, and Robert Rodriguez 
with two points.
The Mules were entered in the 

Amherst Tournament December 
2-4. Their nest regular game 
will be December 7, when they 
travel to Farwell to play the 
Steers.

Council 
Convention 
At Levelland
Tom Pepper presided over the 

Student Council meeting Tues­
day, November 30. at 8:00 a.m. 
in Room 14. The meeting was 
opened with a prayer given by 
Nancy Ramm, the Council 
Chaplain.
This past week Linda Shafer 

and Tom Pepper were in charge 
of seeing that the flags were up 
in front of M.H.S.

Monday. December 13, a Stu­
dent Council Convention will be 
held at South Plains College in 
Levelland. Those attending the
Convention will be Kim Helker, 
Tom Pepper, Martin Nowlin, 
Mark Washington, Randy Wha­
lin, Jeep Shanks. Renee Doug­
lass, Connie Harmon, Mark 
Harmon, Lary Hooten. Charles 
Briscoe, Dean Northcutt, Keith 
Hawkins, Patti Poynor, Steve 
Turner, Curtis Carpenter, and 
the Student Council sponsor. 
Coach Rodney Murphy. Stu­
dents attending have to pay a 
$4.00 registration fee to Dani 
Dunham or Donita Dale before 
December 13.
Christmas is right around the 

corner, and the Student Council 
always supplies M.H.S. with a 
Christmas tree to put in the

front hall. Laura Beene and 
Donita Dale are in charge of 
buying a tree to brighten up the 
halls of M.H.S.

★ ★ ★  ★ ★ ★  
DECA Buys Grades
For Work Incentive

The DECA Club held a meet­
ing on the morning of November 
22. Lisa Mason led the club in 
reading the DECA creed. Mylin- 
da Graves read the minutes of 
the last meeting, Jed Davis gave 
a treasurer’s report, and Kim 
Helker gave a Student Council 
report. Linnie Davis opened the 
floor for new business and there 
were volunteers for working at
the Christmas movie and sug­
gestions for the Vocational 
Christmas party. The members 
were given membership cards 
and the meeting was closed.
The D.E. students were busy 

Thursday writing checks to buy 
their grades. Ever since the first 
of the year, the students have 
been working for money to buy 
grades at the end of the six 
weeks and quarter. The pro­
gram is based on a scale 
converting grades to money. It 
is based on a forty hour work

o f  E n t e r t a i n m e n t
TEXAS SPORTS AND ARTS

Sports will have an increas­
ingly positive role in the life 
of young people—if money 
doesn’t undercut the system.

And the arts will flourish as 
they reach out to incorporate 
broad new audiences.

Those are predictions from 
two prominent Texans sur­
veyed by Context, the Du Pont 
Company's current affairs 
magazine, for a special issue 
devoted to Texas.

The sports expert is Tom 
indry, coach of football's 
rllas Cowboys. He explained 
at he and his team like to 
i>rk with young people in 
iecial programs because “if 
ecan give them correct leader- 
ip and guidance, this is 
here we can do the most 
>od.”
Landry, who is chairman of 
e board of trustees of the 
■llowship of Christian Ath- 
tes, also feels that too much 
nphasis is put on money in 
e recruiting of young profes- 
onal athletes, and “it’s hurt- 
g the game. The great de- 
and for money is turning the 
;ads of many young people." 
As for the arts, David Gock- 
y, director of the Houston 
rand Opera, told Context that 
le arts in Texas are going 
here the people are.
“We schedule programs in 

arks, churches, various the- 
ters around the community,” 
e said. “We will do about 
00 in-school perfo rm ances 
ext year, mainly for grades 

to 12. It’s a chance for 
ingers, d irec to rs , and de- 
igners to  appear in th e  
lassrooms and answer ques- 
ons, to communicate with 
He kids.”

Happy
Birthday

The Journalism Staff would 
like to wish a belated happy 
birthday to the students who 
celebrated a birthday this past 
week and a “ Happy Birthday" 
to the ones who will celebrate a 
birthday this week.
November 30 - Carlos Contrer­

as, Ricky Kennemer, and 
Wayne Ware.
December 2 - Ricky Norton. 
December 4 - Dave Poynor. 
December 5 - Kanctha Hysing- 

er and Laticia Daniels. 
December 7 - Bobby Bartholf. 
December 9 - Shelly Dunham, 

Gloria Hernandez, and Lydie 
Puente.
December 10 - Thurman My­

ers. Julie Barnhill, and Royce
Clay.

December 11 - Laurie Burgess.

Carrier JFK and destroy­
er Bordelon collide.

week whch gives provisions for 
overtime and gives credit for out 
of class work. Extra training and 
pay is provided for clerks who 
fill out payroll checks and 
records, and bankers who keep 
students’ bank statements. 
“ Pay checks” are issued every 
two weeks, and time sheets are 
filled out weekly. A savings 
account is provided for students 
who have made extra money for 
who have made extra money 
from outside projects. The sav­

ings accrues money for exemp­
tion from quarter tests.
The students start out making 

$2.30 an hour. There are three 
pay scales provided to allow for 
raises, and bonuses may be 
given. Sick leave is provided, 
but students may be “ laid off" 
for work stoppage. The “ em­
ployees” decide penalties for 
class disruptions.
The students have learned a 

great deal from this program 
about writing checks, keeping 
records, and handling money. 
The nrogram builds incentive, 
whereas grades sometimes fail. 
This is easily adapted to other 
classes and grading situations.

TSTA Will Present 
Balanced Program

1 he Texas Sjate Teachers As­
sociation will present a bal­
anced. comprehendsive school 
finance program to the 65th 
Legislature in January, includ­
ing all three elements of the 
Minimum Foundation School 
Program, TSTA Executive Sec­
retary Callie W. Smith said 
Tuesday.

“ From its inception, the Foun­
dation School Program (FSP) 
formula has contained three 
basic elements -  salary, main­
tenance and operation, and 
transportation.” Smith pointed 
out.

"TSTA has never asked for an 
increase in one of these without 
increases in the other two, 
because it is a total program,” 
he said.
The TSTA Legislative Commit­

tee met Sunday (November 21) 
to consider a school finance 
plan, among other things. The 
decision will be made within a 
week or 10 days. Smith report­
ed. No specific salary request 
has been adopted.
There is little disagreement 

between TSTA and school fi­
nance proposals made by Gover­
nor Dolph Briscoe on November 
1, "except for his omission of 
salaries as part of the State's 
continuing educational account­
ability and his recommendation 
for a ceiling on local ability to 
improve the state minimum 
program,” the TSTA leader 
noted.

“ We want to work WITH the 
Governor, member sof the Le­
gislature, and other state offi­
cials. for the betterment of the 
total public education pro­
gram," Smith declared. 
Govcrnoe Briscoe's proposals 

November I dealt with mainten­
ance and operations as well as 
transportation, but left out sal­
aries. On November 19 the 
Governor said he would not 
recommend the state funds for 
teacher pay increases, but 
would leave that to local dis­
tricts.

In his original proposal, how­
ever. Briscoe said he would not 
sign a school finance bill unless 
the local school tax limit was cut 
from $1.50 to $1 per $100 
property valuation. In fact, the 
Governor stated it was his intent 
"to enable the local district to 
either hold the line or reduce 
property taxes."
Smith doubted that local dis­

tricts could increase salaries or 
anything else within that finan­
cial straitjacket.
Three principles will be embo­

died in TSTA's salary request: 
—Bring Texas teachers at least 

up to the national average. 
-Recognize the ravages of 

inflation and cost-of-living in­
creases.

-Expand the present 10-step 
state salary schedule to 12 
steps.
"It is people -  trained, experi­

enced. talented, and dedicated 
people -  who are the heart and 
soul of the school system,” 
Smith declared.
Salary is the largest part of the 

FSP cost. Smith pointed out, 
"because people make the sys­
tem work. For the State to 
suddenly shirk its accountability 
in this vital area is unthinka­
ble.”

A special problem faces the 
career teacher with long service. 
Even after 30 or 35 years of 
teaching, a Texas teacher on the 
minimum schedule receives less 
than $14,000 a year. Smith said. 
If the 65th Legislature docs not

grant an increase, more than 25 
percent of the teachers will be 
frozen at their present salary, 
the TSTA leader explained. By 
the second year of the next 
biennium that would increase to 
more than 50 percent.
The November 1 report from 

the Governor’s Office of Educa­
tion Resources stated that "a 
basic program of education is a 
responsibility of the State as a 
whole rather than the individual 
districts.”
The report acknowledged that 

“ as educational costs have ris­
en. State support has not kept
pace.”

Briscoe echoed that sentiment 
in his address that day to 
legislators and school adminis­
trators. He also stated that "in 
the process, we must retain the 
tried and tested formulas that 
have served us well in years 
past."

Smith noted: “Governor Bris­
coe's latest indication that the 
State should not share the cost 
of increasing teacher salaries to 
keep up with soaring inflation, 
which is reflected in other areas 
of government spending, ne­
gates -  in the area of teacher 
salaries -  the principle that 
education is a continuing State 
responsibility.”

Smith called it ‘commendable’ 
for the Governor to recommend 
increasing State funds for public 
schools by $850 million next 
biennium. But that really only 
adds $210 million to the money 
local districts have this year, he 
figured.

"Of the $850 million total 
proposed by the Governor, $640 
million is for shifting local costs 
to the State level," Smith said. 
“ Only $210 million would be 
new money for local districts to 
spend — about $10 per child.” 
The present Texas minimum 

salary is $8,000 for a-beginning 
teacher with a bachelor’s de­
gree. Master's degree teachers 
start at $8,600. Yearly incre­
ments averaging 4.8 percent are 
paid for each year of experience, 
up to 10 steps.

Many local districts already 
supplement the minimum sche­
dule. They also pay the full 
salary of personnel employed 
beyond those for which they 
qualify under the minimum 
program. Local districts pay all 
costs of school construction and 
its financing.
The average salary paid all 

Texas classroom teachers last 
school year (1975-76) was esti­
mated by the Texas Education 
Agency at $11,373. That was 
$1,151 below the $12,524 esti­
mated to be the national aver­
age. Texas ranked 24th among 
the states. Figures for 1976-77 — 
expected to be higher -  will be 
available in the near future and
will be taken into consideration 
in the TSTA salary proposal.
TSTA research indicates that 

the national average classroom 
teacher pay has increased seven 
percent annually for the last five 
years.
Other TSTA legislative propos­

als will deal with teacher retire­
ment, contracts, professional 
consultation, sick leave, and 
certification.
The TSTA Legislative Commit­

tee is planning an intensive 
grassroots campaign to explain 
its legislative program to the 
Legislature and to the public. 
Smith said.

Volkswagen to build plant 
In Pennsylvania.

Reserve Your Annual Now
The 1977 Muletrain annual will 

go on sale Monday, December 
6, and will be sold until Wed­
nesday, December 15.
Everyone in school should buy 

an annual so they can remember 
their years at Muleshoe High 
School. Parents and students 
will enjoy the memories an

Freshmen Boys  
Win Basketball
On November 22, Jhe Mule­

shoe Freshman Mules played 
the Friona Chieftains here to 
start off their basketball season. 
The Mules won that game by a 
score of 52-40. High pointer in 
the game for Muleshoe was 
Mike Northcutt scoring 15 
points. Other scorers were Al 
Ontiveroz, 10 points; James 
Atwood, eight points; Robby 
Barrett, five points; Cody Crit­
tenden and Terry Burton, four 
points; Zeke Pecina, John Car­
rion and Arthur Rojas, all with 
two points.
The Mules traveled to Olton 

November 29 to test their ability 
again. The final score found the 
Mules on top 52-33. High scorer 
for the Mules was Terry Burton 
with 18 points. James Atwood 
scored nine points, Sam Whalin. 
eight points; Zeke Pecina, five 
points; Robby Barrett, Mike 
Northcutt, and Al Ontiveroz, all 
four points and Cody Crittenden 
scored two points. 
Congratulations to these boys 

and their coach, Randy Crook, 
for the beginning of a fine 
season. Good luck fora winning 
season.

annual will bring to them in
years to come.
So remember annuals will be 

on sale December 6-15. The cost 
of the 1977 annual will be $8.40 
lor the regular annual and 
$10.50 for a personalized annu­
al. The $10.50 annual has the 
student’s name stamped on the 
cover and a plastic cover to 
protect the annual.
Annuals can be bought from 

any of the Journalism students. 
They are Laura Beene, Stepha­
nie Brantley, Tammy Bruns, 
Cherylee Bryant, Gina Burden, 
Billy Donaldson, Tammye 
Hicks. Mitzi Mardis, Robert 
Martin. Ricky Norton, Patti 
Poynor. Nancy Ramm, Gwen 
Reeder. Benetta Roming, 
Dwayne Shafer and Sheryl Sto­
vall. Mrs. Lucy Faye Smith is 
the annual advisor.

The FFA Chapter met Novem­
ber 29, during orientation. Ro­
bert Martin opened the meet­
ing. The citrus fruit sale was 
discussed. The fruit will be in 
December 8. Fruit can still be 
ordered from any FFA member.
The chapter voted on two 

delegates for the sweetheart 
contest to be held at the District 
banquet. Delegates are Robby 
Young and Glenda Rasco.
Darrell Rasco. the District 

President, reminded everyone 
about the District Banquet, 
which will be held at Morton, 
December 6, at 7:30 p.m.

I Mulette Maneuvers
The Varsity Mulettes pushed 

their record to 3-1 with a 
thrilling, last minute victory 
over Farwell Tuesday night. 
73-70. The Mulettes fell behind 
seventeen points in the third 
quarter, but they rallied back 
and went ahead with less than 
one minute to play. It took an 
outstanding effort in the fourth 
period to get the victory and the 
Mulettes gave that effort. Prior 
to the Farwell contest, the 
Mulettes defeated Tulia 61-49 in 
their first home game. In anoth­
er close contest, the Muleshoe 
girls edged Hale Center 62-59. 
The Mulettes participated in the 
Friona Tournament this past 
weekend but results were not 
known at this writing. They will 
play at Farwell, Tuesday, De­
cember 7, and then in the 
Levelland Tournament. Decem­
ber 9-11.
The Junior Varsity also has a 

3-1 record. They narrowly de­
feated Tulia 31-30 in a defensive 
contest. The J.V. Mulettes then 
won over Hale Center by ten 
points. 52-42. To give them 
three straight wins, the J.V. 
beat Farwell 55-44. These girls 
have shown good hustle and 
determination this season, and 
they should prove to have a very 
good team.
The Freshman girls soundly 

defeated their first two oppon­
ents. At Friona they beat the 
Squaws 60-37; and in their first 
home game, they defeated Ol-

New Student 
Welcomed 
By HECE
The HERO girls are very proud 

to announce that they have a 
new HECE student, and the 
best part of it is that he is a boy. 
The new HECE student is 
Jackie Lobaugh. a Senior. He is 
not employed at the present 
time. He plays trombone in the 
Mighty "M ” Band and the 
Stage Band and is a member of 
HERO. Jackie moved to Mule- 
shoe about a year ago from 
Littlefield.
When asked about being a 

HERO member, Jackie eagerly 
responded that he was very shy 
at first about going to a class of 
all girls, but he said it has to 
start somewhere. As he conti­
nues, he feels as if he had been 
in that class for a long time 
because the girls had given him 
a warm welcome. Jackie said, "I 
think 1 like this very much 
already."

ton 58-44. The Freshman Mul­
ettes will play Littlefield Mon­
day night in Muleshoe.

Calendar
for The Week

MONDAY. DECEMBER 6i
One Act Plays - 8 :0 0  p.m.

District FFA Banquet - Mor­
ton.

Ninth Basketball games - Girls 
Here - 7 :0 0  p.m.. Boys - There 

• 7 :0 0  p.m.
TUESDAY, DECEMBER 7t

Varsity and JV basketball 
games - Farwell - there - 5:00
p.m.

WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER
8: FTA Teaching.

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 9:
Varsity Girls Tournament - Lev-
clland.
J.V. Boys and Girls Tourna­

ment - Sudan.
Freshman Bovs Tournament -

Muleshoe.
FRIDAY, DECEMBER 10:Var-

sitv Girls Tournament - Level-
land.
J.V. Boys and Girls Tourna­

ment - Sudan.
Freshman Boys Tournament • 

Muleshoe.
SATURDAY, DECEMBER lit

Varsity Girls Tournament - Lev-
clland.
J.V. Boys and Girls Tourna­

ment - Sudan.
Freshman Boys Tournament - 

Muleshoe.
All-State Band Auditions - 

Lubbock High.

JACKIE LOBAUGH
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Sheryl Stovall

Donlta Dale

Laura Beene Jo Roming
»

Elizabeth IsaacChana Eubanks

Evelyn Grace

Nancy Romm Tanya Burton

Stephanie BrantleyDani Dunham
Glenda Rasco

um  it.. >

Rejina Burden Paula Pepper Coach Bob Graves Coach Ronnie Jones
Benetta Roming

W E S A LU T E TH E M U LE S H O E  M U LET T ES

Denice Reeder Treena Bass Annie Kirven
Toni Beversdorf Penny Howell

WESTERN "66 CO.

MULESHOE CO-OP GINS 
HENRY INSURANCE AGENCY

Beth Witt

NOT PICTURED 
Shoe Penna 
Sherry Washington 
Frances Brown 

Tammie Hicks

jfim.

1

:
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THE 1976-77 LAZBUDDIE LONGHORNS

Lisa Menefee Judy Lust Gina Elliot Angela Matthews Terri Clark Anita Gonzales

Karen Scott Candy Moore Darshan Jennings Tammie Smith Dana McDonald Pat Dale

Dianne McGuire Joe Hawkins Charleson Steinbock Mark Mimms Kandy Smith

The Following Firms Are Behind 
The Longhorns All The Way

Mike Windham

Keith hides

TIDE PRODUCTS 
FOSTER FERTILIZER 

LAZBUDDIE GARAGE 
CLAYS CORNER GIN INC. 

LAZBUDDIE FARMERS SUPPLY

Scott Elliot

Ronald Powell

Mike Mimms

SHERLEY-ANDERSON ELEVATOR INC. L A Z B U D D I E

Not Shown 

Raybom Wenner

Jim Standridge Coach Mickey Wilson Coach Dewayne Sexton Mark Foster
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Water for Texas First 
Priority, Governor Says

AUSTIN—The develop­
ment of the state’s water 
resourced is one of the most 
important undertakings for 
the future of Texas, hut it 
is neither possible nor feas­
ible to draw up in advance 
specific plans for the next 
40 or 50 years, Gov. Dolph 
Briscoe told news media 
representatives at a recent 
capitol press conference.

His statement was in re­
sponse to a reporter’s ques­
tion of why the people of 
Texas have not been told 
exactly how a proposed in­
crease of $400 million in the 
Texas Water Development 
Fund is to be spent. The 
additional $400 million in 
bonds would be authorized 
if Constitutional Amend­
ment No. 1 is passed by the

voters in the Nov. 2 general 
election. Governor Briscoe, 
Lt. Gov. Bill Hobby, House 
Speaker Bill Clayton and 
other state and local politi­
cal and business leaders are 
backing it strongly.

“There has been no com­
mitment yet by the Texas 
Water Development Board 
as to any specific project,” 
the Governor told the news­
men. “The objective of the 
entire program is to develop 
the use and conservation of 
our water resources, and 
this is one of the most im­
portant things for the fu­
ture of Texas. To describe 
in detail at this time how 
this money is to be spent 40 
to 50 years from now is 
just not possible, nor is it 
feasible.”

1976
Governor Briscoe |>ointrd 

out that Texas voters in 
the past have authorized 
the issuance of the first 
$400 million in bonds by the 
Water Development Board 
under the same conditions, 
and relied on the judgment 
und discretion of the hoard 
to administer the fund to 
the best advantage of the 
people of the state. As a re­
sult, 88 loans for water 
development, improvement 
and «mservation projects 
have been made to Texas 
cities, towns, water dis­
trict, river authorities and 
other public utilities.

While some of these proj­
ects are not yet financial­
ly self-sufficient, Governor 
Briscoe said he was confi­
dent they would become so, 
and the revolving fund for 
loans would be self-sustain­
ing.

The governor has ap­
pointed a statewide commit­
tee of approximately 50 
Texans from all areas of

^aOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOQOOOOOOOOOOOOBOOOOOOOOWS

Water Well Development Co.
Of Lubbock

Specializing In Air Frack 
And Air Jet

Helps Develop Old A New 
Irrigation Wolls

New T y p e  D e v e lo p m e n t  B r ings  

l  r r i g a t i o n  & House  Well s  T o Their  

Full  C a p a c i t y

Contact

the state, headed by Paul G. 
Veale, former mayor of Mc­
Allen and longtime business 
and civic leader of that city, 
to work for passage of 
Amendment No. 1.

“We need to look to the 
future, to plan our financ­
ing ahead,” Governor Bris­
coe said. "Every Texan, re­
gardless of where he lives, 
is entitled to adequate wa­
ter of good quality for use 
in his home, and to provide 
jobs, food, fiber and energy 
for the well-being of his 
family.

“The Water Development 
Board and its Fund have 
benefited more than a third 
of our population. They 
have l>een instrumental in 
helping meet the water re­
quirements in many parts 
of Texas.

“Without an adequate 
and dependable water sup­
ply the quality of life we 
now enjoy will he denied 
our children, and their chil­
dren. 1 do not want this to 
be their legacy.”

Randy Lauroneo  
Box  16131 
Lubbock, Toxat

.795-1737  or 762 -0333

or

B ill Kirk land  
210 Rono  

M u lo th  oo, Toxat 

Ph. 272-3331

TOM AMMONS

Europe makes sea t belts 
mandatory.

MORE PLANES
Reacting to a Soviet a i r  

power buildup, the Penta­
gon has announced a major 
increase in U.S. fighter 
plane strength in Western 
Europe including the first 
overseas deployment of the 
new supersonic F15.

LOST HEAT
A G A IN

F F IC IE N T
H O M E

But the Energy Efficient 
Home cuts him off 
at the pass!

The Energy Efficient Home captures Lost Heat.

Lost Heat is heat you pay for that escapes from improperly insulated floors, 
ceilings, and walls. It’s heat that is wasted because of inefficient insulation.

The Energy Efficient Home captures Lost Heat and keeps it in your home so 
you use the heat you pay for.

The total electric Energy Efficient Home saves energy... saves money.

building 
or buying 
a new home? 
ask 
about 
E. E. H.

ivutwiwh w qqis so mum uuou

E N E R G Y  
E F F IC IE N T  

H O M E

" 7 ^
MECTi

vou so mown nom

Tom Ammons 
Funeral Riles 
Held Saturday

Funeral services for Tom Am­
mons. 78, Longtime Bailey 
County resident, were at 2:30 
p.m. Saturday in the St. Mat­
thews Baptist Church with Rev. 
E. McFrazier, pastor, officiat­
ing. Burial followed in Mule- 
shoe Cemetery under direction 
of Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home 
of Muleshoe.

Born January 28, 1898 in 
Williamson, Texas, he had been 
a resident of Bailey County 
since 1937, moving here from 
Waco. Tom Ammons was a 
farmer and a deacon at St. 
Matthews Baptist Church.
He and his wife raised several 

grandchildren in addition to 
their own children.

Survivors include his wife, 
Louise; two sons, Willie Am 
mons, Waco and Raymond Lew 
is, Lubbock; six daughters, Mrs 
Maggie Lewis, Muleshoe; Mrs 
Sofornia Burks, Muleshoe; Mrs 
Lucille Lewis, Muleshoe; Mrs 
Rosalee Dairey, Austin; Mrs 
Tom Ella Brights, Austin and 
Mrs. Lillian Brown, Waco; two 
sisters, Mrs. Ollie Bradshaw, 
and Mrs. Esther Daniel, both of 
Waco; two brothers, James 
Ammons, Fort Worth and Eddie 
Smith, Dallas; several grand­
children and great-grandchil­
dren.

Edward J. Gurney, former 
Senator (R-Fl a), cleared 
of lying to grand jury; 
“ I have a feeling of 

great relief . . .  a feeling 
of great satisfaction.”

TEXAS POULTRY PICTURE 
OUTLINED

Some Texas counties showed a 
sharp increase in poultry pro­
duction during 1975 while oth­
ers showed a drop. Mason, Lee, 
Travis, and Bastrop counties 
increase in turkey production 
while Gonzales, Concho, Hamil­
ton, and Tarrant counties drop­
ped. The top three broiler 
producing counties were Nacag- 
doches, Gonzales and Shelby 
while Gonzales, Shelby and 
Fayette counties led in egg 
production. Increases in egg 
production were recorded in 
Garza, Panola, Val Verde, Den­
ton, Lavaca. Lee, Parker, Co­
manche, Scurry and Lamar 
counties while Dawson and 
Gaines counties showed a con­
siderable drop.

CLASS MEMBERS . . . Waiting for class to begin at the Muleshoe Volunteer Fire Department last week 
were several ’students’ who were attending a Defensive Driving Training school. On completion of the 
three night course, the students were presented certificates.

View From 
The Plain

by J.D. Peer 
I & E Field Officer

WINTER BOATING TIPS
Most of the Texas water skiers 

have stored their gear till next 
spring, but a number of hardy 
boaters such as waterfowl hunt­
ers and winter fishermen can 
still be found on our lakes and 
streams.
Cold weather compounds the 

chances for a boater to commit a 
boating error or mistake and 
Texas Parks and Wildlife De­
partment figures verify this fact.

In 1975, 118 individuals drown­
ed in Texas from falling over­
board. Winter temperatures and 
icy boats go hand-in-hand as 
these skippers head for the duck 
blind or favorite walleye ‘hole’.
Capsizing is the number one 

killer in boating accidents and 
staying with the boat until 
rescued is recommended by 
both P&WD and U.S. Coast 
Guard officials.

Most small boats continue to 
float even when turned over or 
full of water. Because of the 
extra flotation built in, the boat 
will normally float even with the 
engine still attached to the boat.
There’s always the temptation 

to immediately swim ashore. 
But, when you’re in the water 
you can’t correctly judge the

distance to shore. In addition, 
you should stay with the boat 
because it can be more easily 
seen by other boaters.

Most experienced wintertime 
boaters suggest you wear your 
life vest or PFD at all times 
regardless of whether the boat 
is underway or not.

Being caught in foul weather in 
a small craft can be a harrowing 
experience for anyone. This is 
why the P&WD says “ Keep an 
eye on the weather". Some 
types of bad weather cannot be 
predicted with great accuracy 
such as fog.

When wind and water start to 
build, it is time to head for 
shelter. Learn and know your 
boat's capabilities and limita­
tions in rough water. When 
heading into heavy waves, it is 
generally best to steer the boat 
so that the waves hit the boat 
slightly on one side of the bow .

Head for the lee side of a n 
island or point of land where tile 
wind and waves are not so high. 
If it is impossible to get to shore, 
use your motor to keep the craft 
headed into the wind with just 
enough power for steering. 
Don’t use an anchor unless the 
motor quits, and then only from 
the bow. Keep low in the cockpit 
and bail any water taken 
aboard.

Several boaters have stayed 
aboard overnight until the wind 
and weather subsided. It is 
advisable to carry extra warm 
clothing and bedding aboard for 
one of these unexpected stays 
overnight.

Advise someone of your desti­

nation on the lake and also give 
the approximate time of return 
from your boatine activities. 
This will alert a rescue team it 
you fail to return within a 
reasonable time.

More information about safe 
boating is available from your 
nearest U.S. Coast Guard auxi­
liary or the P&WD official in 
your area.

BUILDING CONTRACTS
Construction contracts in 

1977 will total $114 billion, 
12 per cent more than this 
year’s anticipated level of 
$102 billion, as announced 
by the McGraw-Hill Infor­
mation Systems, an author­
ity on the construction 
market.

ATTENTION 
MULESHOE A I E A  

CATTLEMEN
...In regard to dead stock 
removal . . .  If you have a 

I problem with service . . . 
whether In the feed yard or 
on the farm . . . Please 
give US a chance! Thank You.

YOUR LOCAL USED
COW DEALER IN

MULESHOE
Ph. 965-2903
Mobil 965-2429
MaUsko*

Bi-Pro8«cts
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IG IB SO N '

DKouhTceHTER
PRICES EFFECTIVE 

DEC. 5-8

TEXAS INSTRUMENTS
ELECTRONIC

CALCULATOR
TI-1200 

REG 12.95

DEODORIZING CLEANER

LYS0L
28 oz. REG 1.41

ON GUARD Si-812

BURGLAR 
ALARM

ELECTRONIC VEHICLE 
BU R G LA R  A L A R M  SYSTEM REG 29.97

MODEL 822DAISY POWER LINE
.22 CAL.

PELLET GUN $ 0 0 9 7
WITH RIFLED B A R R E *

REG 39.99

GENERAL ELECTRIC 
HI-POWER

FLASH CUBES
FOR P O L A R O ID  F O C U S E D F L A S H  C A M E R A S  
2 CUBES 8 G U A R A N T E E D  FLASHES
REG  1.69

A G R E A T ^ H R I S T M A S  GIFT 
THE GREAT NEW FLAVOR IN SLOW ,
COVERED C O O K IN G

BIG BOY CHARCOAL » * » * * • *
WATER SMOKER
REG 27.97 FACTORY 2nd

HILLS BROS.

COFFEE
1 LB.

G IA N T  SIZE
TIDE

LAUNDRY
DETERGENT
49 oz.

CRISCO
PURE VEGETABLE OIL
38 ox.

PRELL

SHAMPOO
7 oz.

REG. 1.37

CREST

TOOTHPASTE
7 oz.

REG 1.27

DUNREATH

MENS SOCKS
REG 1.29 ________

MALIBU
BARBIE
TWIST N  TURN 
W AIST  BENDABLE  
LEGS, POSEABLE

REG 2.99
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INDOOR GRILL POPULAR . . .  In an alcove backed by Mexican tile 
is an indoor grill in the Demp Foster home at Lazbuddie, carrying 
out the motif featured throughout the home.

UPSTAIRS BEDROOM . . Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Morris enjoy the master bedroom of their 'A ' frame
home which is upstairs in the home. Their daughter, has a bedroom on the lower floor of the home just

UNIQUE LIVING . . .  In the Melvin Morris 'A' fram home at Lazbuddie is a feeling ot spaciousness in the 
open rooms. Mrs. Morris relaxes in a large chair in the living room with the dining area featured in the 
background.

south of Clay s Corner.

The Annual Parade Of Area Homes
Sunday, December 5 , 1 9 7 6

TREE FEATURED . . . One of two trees in the Bill Loyd home is this tall, formal and traditional 
Christmas tree in the living room. In the sun room is an individual tree with unique decorations for the 
Loyd's granddaughter.

DOUBLE DOORS INTO HOME . . . Just inside the courtyard of the 
Demp Foster home is a double door entry. The doorway is decorated 
with greenery and red peppers in a Southwestern motif.

WHITE STONE FIREPLACE . . .  In the home of Mr. and Mrs. Dud Winders east of Lazbuddie is this
white stone fireplace. Mrs. Winders said the fireplace is the focal point of their living room of wrought 
iron and paneling.

FORMAL ENTRY . . . Entering the Bill Loyd home is stepping into 
formal spendor. This entry is decorated for Christmas featuring 
greenery and candles. On the right is the living room.

GROUPED FOR INTIMACY . . . Western and southwestern decorations are featured in the Demp Foster 
Living room at their home east of Lazbuddie. The furniture is arranged in a more intimate setting around 
the fireplace. DINING AREA FEATURED . . . Mrs. Dud Winders is justifiably proud of her dining area in their home 

east of Lazbuddie. She chose heavy Spanish type furniture in keeping with the Spanish decorations 
throughout her home.
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Many people attended the 
Thanksgiving supper Wednes­
day evening at the Baptist 
Church.

Mr. and Mrs. John Latham 
drove to Slaton Thanksgiving 
day and visited in the home of 
their daughter. Mr. and Mrs 
Warner DeSautell and boys. 
Chris and Cliff. Other relatives 
joined them in Slaton.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. V.C. Weaver 

had with them Thanksgiving 
day their daughter. Mrs. Marie

Suggs and a granddaughter and 
family. Mr. and Mrs. Timothy 
Wochamurka and children, ail 
of Lubbock.

* * * * *
Three Way Junior High boys 

and girls teams played Bledsoe 
Monday evening on the home 
court. The boys won their game 
28-26 and the girls won 20-19. 

* * * * *
Company with the H.M. Blacks 

during Thanksgiving were hei 
son and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Coldston and boys, oi 
Amarillo; his daughter. Mr. and 
Mrs. James Carroll and chil­
dren, of Abilene, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Alan Black of Bula. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Bryan 

drove to Friona for Thanksgiv­
ing and spent the day with her 
sister and husband, the Otis

T E jy E X ,
HEARING a i d s

CLOVIS HEARING AID CENTER
★  Batteries ★ H o ld s  ★ F re e  Hearing Tests

SERVICE A U  MAKES
-403 E 14th CtovlJ, N.M. Pho 763-6900

Neels.
* * * * *

Vvette Cox spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Leo Wallace 
and Rhonda. Mrs. J.D. Cox and 
Mrs. Wallace are sisters. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Crume drove 

to Temple Wednesday and 
spent the Thanksgiving holidays 
with a daughter, Miss Diane 
Crume. Also with them was 
another daughter and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. Danny Smith of 
Dallas.

* * * * *
Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 

C.L. Cannon for the Thanksgiv­
ing holidays were their daugh­
ter. Mr. and Mrs. R.E. Martin 
of Lubbock; Miss Beverly Mar­
tin. student at Baylor Law 
School. Waco; Mrs. Jimmy Can­
non. and Timmy of Bula and 
Janice Cannon, student at Tech. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Hall and 

son and Mr. and Mrs. Monty 
Cox and son of Littlefield, were 
guests Thanksgiving day with 
their parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Dewitt Tiller. His parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Hoyt Tiller of Bula, 
were with them.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Ashel Richard­

son, accompanied by their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Richardson 
and children, of Muleshoe. and 
Mrs. Jerry Teaff of Bula, spent

Thanksgiving day in Lubbock 
visiting in the home of her sister 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Dixon.

* * * * *
Jeryl Bellar Jr. celebrated his 

third birthday with a brithday 
supper Saturday at the home ot 
his grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
E.C. Bellar.

ing with his grandparents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Bogard. Also 
with them Thanksgiving day 
were Mr. and Mrs. Ray Kenni- 
son and girls of Olton.

*  *  *  *  •

Following several light hearts 
attacks. A.P. Fred has been

transferred from a private room 
to IC'D at Lubbock Methodist 
Hospital.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. John Blackman 

visited relatives in Lubbock 
Thanksgiving day.

Mrs. John Hubbard returned 
home Wednesday from spend­
ing the Thanksgiving holidays 
with a daughter and family, Mr. 
and Ms. Barney Oldfield and 
girls, at Grants, N.M.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Nolan Harland 

attended the funeral of Walter 
Sanders Friday, at the First 
Methodist Church in Claude. 
Sanders was Harlan's uncle. 

* * ***
Mr. and Mrs. Ewell Battles 

drove to Hollis, Oklahoma Wed­
nesday and spent until Friday 
visiting in the home of her 
brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Estes.

* ****
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Withrow 

had all of their children and 
grandchildren with them for 
Thanksgiving.

* ****
Mr. and Mrs. Bo Gaston and 

daughters from Granbury, 
drove up and spent Thanksgiv-

First Shipments of Oranges 
Leave Rio Grande Valley

AUSTIN-The 1976-1977 
Texas citrus season got 
underway on schedule with 
the first shipment of oranges 
leaving the Lower Rio 
Grande Valley during late 
September.

Many observers believe 
the citrus crop, including 
both oranges and grapefruit, 
is of even higher quality than 
last year.

“The excellent growing 
season, with timely rains and 
adequate water for irrigation, 
has resulted in a heavy fruit 
c r o p , ”  A g r i c u l t u r e

Commissioner John C. White 
said.

“ And some citrus growers 
are expecting a larger harvest 
than last year’s 17.1 million 
boxes.”

Grapefruit is expected to 
account for most of the 
increased production.

The orange crop is 
forecast to be about the 
same as last year. The 
1 9 7 5 -  1 9 7 6  crop  was 
approximately 3.8 million 
boxes, 30 percent above the 
previous season.

• * * * *
A child born in 1900 could 

expect to live an average of 
about 47 years. A child born in 
1974 could expect to live an 
average of 72 years, reports 
Mrs. Vivian Blair, family life 
education-aging-specialist with 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, The Texas A&M 
University System.

ATTENDTHECHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH .
Rev. Floyd Dunn 
507 West Second. Muleshoe

MULESHOE 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
517 S. First 
H.D. Hunter, Pastor

RICHLAND HILLS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
17th and West Ave. D 
'Gerald Pepper. Pastor

CHURCH OF 
THE NAZARENE 
Ninth & Ave. C 
David Gray. Pastor

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 
.621 South First 
Afton Richards. Elder

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Avenue G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00

LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION 
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
Morton Highway 
Edwin L. Manning, Pastor 
Sunday Morning Service

TEMPLO BAUTISTA 
Rev. Ynes Aleman 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Preaching Service 10:45 a.m.
Training Hour 6:00 p.m.
Preaching Service 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
8:00 p.m.

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
1733 West Ave. C 
James Williams, Pastor

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 E. Ave. B 
Rev. David Evetts

PROGRESS SECOND 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays

Compliments of

AVI, INC.
Hwy 84 W . 272-4266

9 t  takeA a Q&od
TO THREAD 

A NEEDLE
Did you ever thread a needle?

. . .  Most everyone has, it 
takes a good eye, for the 

opening is small. Did you 
ever try to thread one while 

someone else held the needle?
. . .  This is almost impossible. All 

this brings us to the point th a t. . .  
there are some things that we must do 

ourselves. We can not send someone 
else to church for us, we can not 

have someone else worship the 
Lord for us. These things 

are strictly on an 
individual basis. 

ATTEND CHURCH

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor

MULESHOE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
8th Street and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor

ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
9:30 a.m.
Worshin Services 
10:30 a.m.

JEHOVAH'S WITNESS 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
220 West Ave. E 
Rev. J.E. Meeks
SPANISH
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina

ST. MATTHEW 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
West Third 
E. McFrazier, Pastor

NORTHSIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street
PROGRESS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Progress, Texas 
Dannv Currv, Pastor
SIXTEENTH & AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
Terrv Bouchelle. Minister
IMMACULATE
CONCEPTION
CATHOLIC CHURCH
Father Timothy Schwertner
Northeast of City in Morrison
Edition
MULESHOE
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Clovis Highway
Royce Clay, Minister

BEAVERS FL0WERLAND
1 Flowers for a ll occasions'

272-J024 272-3116

BRATCHER MOTOR 
SUPPLY

107 E. Ave. B. 272-4288

Dairq  
Queen

Margie Hawkins, 
^  Manager

272-3412

ST. CLAIRS
110 Main

IBSON’S
D IS C O U N T  C I N T H T

1723 West American Blvd. 272-4306

218 Main

WATSON ALFALFA
Alfalfa Hoy

.272-3552 272-4038

Compliments of

STATE LINE IRRIGATION
Littlefield-Muleshoe-Lev el land

BC
401 S. First 
MULESHOE 

ph. 272-4511

MULESHOE 
PUBLISHING CO.

BAILEY COUNTY 
MEMORIAL PARK

' Every Service A Sacred Trust" 
272-4383

WHITES CASHWAY 
GROCERY

402 Main
Where Friends Meet and Prices Talk'

WHITT-WATTS-REMPE 
IMPLEMENT CO.

John Deere Dealer
Muleshoe 272-4297

MULESHOE CO-OP 
GINS

WESTERN DRUG
||4 Main

WRINKLE WELDING 
t  MACHINE

909 W. American Blvd. 272-4486

BLACK INSURANCE 
AGENCY

105 W . Ave.  D. 272-3292

BOB’S SAFETY CENTER
Wheel Aligning, Brakework 
Automotive Air Conditioning

272-J04J________________

DARI-DELITE DRIVE IN
Take Out Orders

210 N . First 272-4482

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK

' Home Owned'
224 S. First

LAMBERT CLEANERS
Steam Curpet Cleaning 

Drapery Cleaning 
l 2 3 M a i r ^ K ^

UP, UP AND AWAY . . .  As a freshman forward attempts to lob into 
another basket last week, an Olton guard made a futile attempt to 
block the two points. Her efforts were to no avail as the Muleshoe 
freshman girls waltzed away with the game.

Farmers Union Is Developing 
New Legislative Programs
Development of a state and 

national legislative program an ' 
groundwork on a state fan i

B a n i - i
It!

BUI Loyd, President 
Muleshoe State Bank

When you establish an 
Individual Retirem ent Ac­
count . . . commonly called 
IRA . . . the in terest the 
account earns each year at the 
bank is not subject to income 
tax. Income tax is paid only 
after the withdrawals begin. 
In addition, you also defer the 
tax on the amount invested 
until the withdrawals begin.

A word of caution. If with­
draw als are made from an 
IRA account before the age of 
59'/i, a federal regulation re­
quires a penalty payment of 
10 percent on the amount 
withdrawn from the account.

Another advantage of IRA 
is seldom discussed. When an 
individual re tire s  from a 
company and receives a lump 
sum amount from his em­
ployer’s retirement plan, the 
amount is ordinarily subject 
to immediate taxation.* 
However, if the amount re­
ceived from the plan . . . less 
voluntary contributions . . .  is 
deposited within 60 days to an 
IRA, taxes are avoided until 
withdrawals begin.

There's no better time than 
now to find out if you qualify 
for an IRA. We'll be happy to 
discuss the possibilities.

policy for 1977 will begin when 
the Board of Directors of the 
Texas Farmers Union meets in 
Abilene December 3 and 4. The 
eleven-member executive board 
and the narly eighty county 
presidents composing the full 
board assemble to organize the 
general business of TFU prior to 
the annual convention calendar­
ed for late January in Amarillo.

A separate program drafting 
committee meets in conjunction 
with the board on December 2 
and 3 to compile county resolu­
tions into a state and national 
legislative program for agricul­
ture. The proposed draft will be 
presented to the delegates at 
the general convention.
"The Texas Farmers Union is 

anticipating dynamic growth 
and forceful effects on farm 
programs during this our 75th 
year of service to state agricul­
ture," says Jay Naman, State 
President of TFU.
In addition to the administra­

tive business needed to coordi­
nate the eight thousand plus 
state members, the Board of 
Directors will be electing two 
District Directors to fill expiring 
terms and one resigned scat in 
the TFU's nine-district makeup. 
Determination of the top county 
organization for 1976 will also 
be made for recognition at the 
January convention in Amarillo. 

Serving on the 1976 Flxecutivc 
Board arc: Jay I. Naman of 
Waco. President; Joe Rankin of 
Ralls, Vice President; A.G. Flip- 
pen of Vega. District I Director, 
W.R. Sage of Lubbock, District 
II Director; Billy Bob Toombs of 
Merkel. District III Director; Lee 
Starr of Cisco, District IV Direc­
tor; A.J. Wleczyk, Jr. of Rich 
mond. District V Director; Jerry 
Blacketer of Trenton. District VI 
Director; Ronnie Pitts of Bart­
lett, District Vll Director; Alfred 
E. Perry of Big Spring. District
VIII Director; and Mrs. David 
Samuclson of Coupland, District
IX Director.

Public Auction
SUNDAY, DECEMBER 12, 1974 -  2:00 P.M. 

NEW MFRCIIANIMM:
VELVET. TWEED, VINYL SOFAS AND 

LOVE SEATS

MAPic & WALNUT BEDROOM SUITES 

BARREL BAR A ? SlO O iS 

BARREL GAME TABLE & 4 CHAIRS 

TABLE AND HANGING LAMPS 

HANGING POTS 

SPANISH PLAQUES

USED MERCHANDISE:
19165 1975 CARS TRUCKS, PICKUPS

BEDROOM SUITES

COOK STOVES

REFRIGERATORS

HEADBOARDS AND FRAMES

TWEED ROCKING RECLINERS

BOX SPRING & MATTRESSES
(Requlor, Queen, King, Twin)

DINETTE SUITES 

HUTCHES

HOBBIE MISCELLANEOUS 

LIVING ROOM TABLES 

BUNK BEDS A BUNKIES

COUNTERS ANO SHELVES 

COLOR TELEVISIONS 

LIVING ROOM CHAIRS 

HEATERS

SHOP EQUIPMENT

K n o u l e J  f u r n i t u r e  e d u c t i o n
1131 WEST AMERICAN UVD MILESNIL TEXAS

ITER MONIAT SATUROAV 1:31 I V  TO I I I  MWe Will BUY. SELL, er TtADC F*r A n y * * *  O f Vol»e 
11C IN S* NO ThGC-76-OSCO
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Brad BakerDean Northcutt Marcus Beversdorf Mark Washington Mike Wisian Dan Vinson

Jimmy Ybarra Kevin Smith Robert Brown

1 A
Danny Wilson

4 0
Ricky Hayes

Lary Hooten David StevensMack NormanRandy Whalin >•»-•«■ Curtis Carpenter Charles Briscoei

Eddie Crego Dickie Sudduth Jeep Shanks Donnie Long Dennis PattersonRobert Rodriguez

Coach Rodney Murphy

MULESHOE

Jerry Wheat Terry Shafer Coach Raymond Schroeder

B A C K IN G  T H E 7 6 - 7 7  M U LE S H O E  M U LES

STATE BANK
Member FDIC 272-4561
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D ea r  S an ta

Dear Santa,
I want a Steve Austin and a 

bike with two wheels and the 
stretch man and the mouse trap 
and some racing cars. Susan 
wants Baby-That-A-Way.
Love,
Shawn Rejino• • • • •

Dear Santa Claus,
1 want a tricycle. Also I would 

like a little swing for my little 
sister.

Love,
Issac Garcia

Dear Santa Claus,
I want a little gun that shoots a 

car out. and a Bionic man, too. 
And Evel Knevel and a Big Gym 
set.
Love,
Jimmy Cain

Dear Santa Claus,
1 want some racing cars and 

Stretch Armstrong, and a Teddy 
Bear and a color book. I’ve been 
good.

Love,
Michael Kiggins 

•  • • • •
Dear Santa Claus,
I want a little doll that eats and

drinks her bottle and a purse 
and a watch. My little brother 
wants a dump truck and a little 
guitar. My little sister needs a 
baby rattler.

We have been very good all 
year.

Love,
Hilda Trevizo

• * * • •
Dear Santa.
I want a Baby-Alive and my 

sister wants a Baby-Alive, too. 
My little brother wants a toy 
gun. My big brother wants 
another B-B gun. I want to give 
my mother a new coffee pot and 
my father some new shoes. 
That's all.

Love,
Estella Orozco 

Dear Santa,
I want a dolly. My brother 

Tony wants toys. My sister 
Mary Alice wants a doll. Jessie 
wants a play gun and Gino 
wants a play gun. My daddy 
wants a real gun and my mother 
wants to live in town in a new 
house. My dog wants some dog 
food and mother wants a big 
bowl for cheerios.

Love. Bebie Gauna 
* * * * *

Dear Santa Claus,
Please bring me a dolly that 

makes a party and a little 
television. And a baby-that-a-

way. That’s all. 
Love,
Socorro Guzman

Dear Santa,
I want a truck, and a gun and 

that's all.
Love,
Jeffrey Daniel

• • • • »
Dear Santa,

I want some dishes and a doll. 
My little sister wants a doll and 
she likes purses. My little 
brother wants a truck and my 
other brother likes pencils. My 
mama wants a watch. My 
grandmama wants a housecoat, 
my auntie wants something, 
too.

Love.
Collene Lewis

Dear Santa Claus.
I'm a nice boy. My sister wants 

a doll with a bottle and my big 
sister wants something. I want 
an Evel Knevel.

Love,
Michael Castro

• *  *  *  •

Dear Santa,
I want an electric train and a 

racing car and some little cars 
on a track. My brother said he 
wants a crane.
Love,
Shaun Hill

* * * * *
Dear Santa,

^  You and your business partner may agree the 
survivor will buy the other’s share. But can 
either of you raise the cash?

Let’s talk instant-cash. Professionally.55
' 7 1

Vic Benedict 
721 W. Ave. C 
Ph. 272-3218

Southwestern Life E l
Hefymgpeopb. -/tm&Ktr/tmMK,

1 want a Baby-Alive and some­
thing else. Please bring my 
baby a doll.

Love,
Amanda Perales 

* * * * * t
Dear Santa Claus,

Hello. 1 want three toys. 1 want 
clay, children's calculator and a 
little green train.

Love,
Andrew Espinoza 

• * • • •
Dear Santa,

I want a doll, and a table and 
some dishes and 2 chairs.

Love,
Carrie Perkins

Dear Santa Claus,
1 want an Evel Knevel, G.I. 

Joe. That's all. Bring something 
for my sisters, too.
Love,
Charlie Reyna

*  *  *  *  •

Dear Santa,
1 want Baby-That-A-Way and 

an Easy-Bake Oven.
Love,
DeAun Crozier

• • • • •
Dear Santa Claus,

Please bring me a toy. My 
baby sister wants a rag doll and 
bring a toy for my brother.

Love,
Deigo Belez

• *  *  *  «

Dear Santa,
1 want a typewriter, a stretch 

man and a bike.
Love,
Esther Acosta

Dear Santa Claus,
I want roller skates, and Baby- 

That-A-Way.
Love,

. Heather Baker
* * * »  «

Dear Santa Claus,
I want a motorcycle, a gun and 

a rifle.
Love,
Efrain Herrera 

Dear Santa,
1 want you to come to my house '  

and give me some presents. 1 
want Evel Knevel and a 6 
Million Dollar Man and a whole

lot of other toys. And some 
clothes for the party.

Love,
Toby Carpenter

• *  *  • •

Dear Santa, ,
1 want a B-B gun. and Fonzie, 

some B-Bs, Evel Knevel.
Love,
Javier Reyna

Dear Santa Gaus,
I want a Baby-That-A-Way. 

Also a sewing machine for my 
sister Angelica and a Cry Baby 
for my baby sister, Elizabeth. 

Love,
Mary Jane Hernandez 

• * * * *

Dear Santa,
I am S years old. I will go to 

school next year. 1 would like a 
Stretch Armstrong, a bike, and 
Steve Austin. 1 really want the 
bike, so maybe another boy or 
girl could have the other toys. 1 
have 2 brothers. We love you.

Thank you Santa Claus, 
Gyle Dale

Dear Santa Claus,
I want a Barbie doll and a 

Tuesday Taylor. 1 want a Ken 
doll and his clothes.

I Love Santa Claus,
Mandy Collins.

Rt. 4, Muleshoe

F a r m - fa c t s
A Weekly Report Of Agri-Business Newt

Compiled From Sources Of The 
TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

John C. White, Commissioner

Outlook Bleak For 
Rice Market In 1977
Texas and the rest of the nation 

are in a tight over the rice 
situation, and little relief seems 
on the way for producers, 
according to an agricultural 
economist at Texas A&M Uni­
versity.

With carryover to total some 43 
million hundredweights by the 
end of the current marketing 
year, supply lines will remain 
choked, says Dr. Randall Stelly 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service and Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Sta­
tion. "Domestic consumption of 
rice is at an average level for the 
year, but exports are moving 
slowly despite government 
help,” he points out.
The government target price 

for rough rice was set at $8.25 a 
hundredweight while the mar­
ket price in Texas is currently at 
$6.36. "This may send produc­
ers and farmers into a weak 
economic situation, with 1977 
production costs expected to run 
$8.39 per hundredweight in the 
eastern part of the Texas Rice 
Belt and $8.92 in the western 
section," notes Stelly.

"The large supplies and carry­
overs of rice will hang over the 
market like a sword held by a 
hair,” contends the economist.

Looking at 1977, U.S. produc-

DEKALB HYBRIDS

Proven in1976 
University Test
The best answer to the head 
smut problem is simple. But, 
it’s hard to come by. That's 
corn hybrids with head smut 
resistance.

DEKALB’S got’em. Hybrids 
with top yield potential and 
head smut resistance. It’s 
proven.

A 1976 Texas A&M Univer­
sity Test showed DEKALB 
can deliver head smut re­

sistance. And better yet, the 
DEKALB hybrids that dem­
onstrated the most head 
smut resistance are also 
delivering top yields to local 
farmers. That m eans no 
yield sacrifice for head smut 
resistance.

There’s no question that 
there is a difference among 
corn hybrids when it comes 
to head smut resistance. So 
see your DEKALB dealer 
today. Put in your order for 
the DEKALB Smut Fighters:

XL-75
DEKALB XL-75...It stands great, yields 
big and fights head smut. Here’s the new 
leader in Texas Corn Country. XL-75 pro­
duces big, hefty ears packed with quality 
grain. It has an outstanding record in 
DEKALB Performance Tests and in farm­
ers’ fields. And, it was found to be ex­
tremely resistant to head smut in a 1976 
university trial.

XL-372
DEKALB XL-372... It’s a big eared beauty 
that fights head smut. A top-performing 
hybrid with high head smut resistance 
ratings in a 1976 university trial. Produces 
large, girthy ears at high or low popula­
tions. Excellent stalks, strong shanks. 
DEKALB XL-372 has an attractive field 
appearance with its semi-upright leaves 
and healthy, robust look.

A t a condition o» sa lt puras* note statement of kmited war 
ranty and remedy on D fK A LB  orders and tags

Way Ahead With Research
“DCKALB" 1* • registered brand name Numbara dargnala hybrid*

ers expect to plant 500,000 acres 
more than the 1.8 million acres 
allotted. However, this will be 
about 166,000 acres under the 
1976 crop. The Texas crop is 
forecast at 500,000 acres, 40,000 
above the allotment figure but 
20,000 acres less than this year. 

“ Market conditions will conti­
nue to be plagued by overpro- 
dcution in the U.S.,” contends 
Stelly. “ This along with an 
average rice crop in other parts 
of the world will continue to put 
U.S. and Texas producers in an 
economic pressure-cooker.”

December 6 -10 -1976

Lazbuddie 
School Menu

MONDAY
Ravioli with Meat Sauce 
White Beans 
Spinach
Combread - Butter 
Peanut Butter Cake 
Chocolate or White Milk 
TUESDAY 
Chicken Casserole 
Cranberry Sauce 
Sweet Potatoes 
English Peas 
Hot Rolls - Butter 
Butterscotch Pudding 
Milk
Orange Juice 
WEDNESDAY
Burritos - Hot Sauce 
Buttered Corn 
Green Salad 
Fruit Jell-o 
Milk
THURSDAY
Hamburgers and 
Sloppy Joes 
Potato Sticks 
Pickles - Lettuce 
Pears
Chocolate or White Milk 
FRIDAY
Corndogs - Mustard 
Pork and Beans 
Cole Slaw 
Cornbread - Butter 
Fruit Drops 
Milk

Change Coming... Cotton Production Dips Again ... 
Citrus Outlook Good . .. Cattle On Feed Down and Up.

As of Jan. 1, 1977, there will be a change in 
certification of seed. New standards will be limited to 
genetic identity. When you buy certified seed, you will 
need to study both labels on the bag of seed.

The analysis label will help you determine if the seed 
quality meets your requirements. Detailed information will 
be presented in a future column, but remember it takes 
effect Jan. 1, 1977.

The change is being made to encourage competition for 
producing higher quality seed and to establish uniformity 
with the federal seed act. 4b

W H ILE  O TH ER  CRO P PRO D U C T IO N  E ST IM A T E S
are about steady with a month ago, one exception is in 
cotton, the Texas Crop and Livestock Reporting Service 
notes.

Upland cotton production for the state is now set at
2.850.000 bales, down 150,000 bales from a month ago. 
An early October freeze is the major reason for the decline.

Harvested acres are unchanged from last month at 
4,500,000. Yield per acre is set at 304 pounds.

Sorghum production is unchanged at 318,000,000 
bushels. This is 15 per cent below a year ago. Harvest of the 
crop is now virtually complete throughout the state.

Corn production estimate is still set at 161,000,000 
bushels. Yield per acre of 115 bushels sets a new record.

Production estimates for rice are also unchanged from 
a month ago. Peanut production yield is now estimated at 
1,500 pounds per acre which is a decline of 50 pounds from 
a month ago. Sugarbeet yield is unchanged from a month 
ago, and sugarcane production is now estimated to be 5 per 
cent more than a year ago.

C IT R U S  PRO SPECTS also continue unchanged. The
17.700.000 box forecast for the state is 5 per cent more 
than last year, and is almost 50 per cent above the small 
crop of 1974-75.

Total production of grapefruit is expected to be
11.500.000 boxes. This would be 7 per cent more than last 
year.

Production of all oranges is projected at 6,200,000 
boxes. The forecast for early and mid-season oranges is
3.800.000 boxes, and Valencias are forecast at 2,400,000 
boxes.

C A T T LE  ON FE ED  IN T E X A S  shows a decline from a 
year ago but an increase from a month ago.

There were 1,660,000 head of cattle and calves on feed 
in Texas as of Nov. 1, which is 6 per cent under a year ago 
but 14 per cent above a month ago.

Texas cattle feeders placed 523,000 head into their lots 
during October.

In the seven major feeding states, (Texas, Arizona, 
California, Colorado, Iowa, Kansas, and Nebraska) cattle on 
feed was down 4 per cent from a year ago.

Singlelon-Blis funeral Home
24 Hour AmbJcnce Sendee 

Fh 272-4574 M Jeshoe

SUNNY—MONEY 
SHELTERED EROM TAXES IN 

YOUR OWN INDIVIDUAL 
RETIREMENT ACCOUNT

NOW IS THE TIME TO PLAN FINANCIALLY FOR THAT BRIGHT 
FUTURE THAT WE ALL DREAM OF. NO MATTER WHAT YOUR 
AGE OR WHAT YOU ARE DOING FOR A LIVING. THE TIME TO 
THINK ABOUT RETIREMENT IS NOW! IF YOU ARE PRESENTLY 
WORKING AND DON'T HAVE A PENSION PLAN. PROFIT-SHARING 
OR OTHER QUALIFIED RETIREMENT PROGRAM. WE WILL HELP 
TAILOR ONE TO YOUR PERSONAL NEEDS.

FIFTEEN PERCENT OF YOUR INCOME (UP TO S I500) CAN BE 
DEPOSITED ANNUALLY IN AN IRA ACCOUNT. WHILE IT IS BUILD­
ING FINANCIAL SECURITY FOR YOUR RETIREMENT YEARS, IT 
WILL ALSO BE EARNING TAX DEDUCTIONS FOR YOU NOW.

COME IN AND TALK TO US TODAY ABOUT PLANNING FOR YOUR 
SUNNY FUTURE. DON’T DELAY. DECEMBER 3 1 ST IS THE DEAD 
LINE FOR DEPOSITS WHICH MAY BE DEDUCTED FROM 1976 TAXES.

S A V IN G S J A N D  L O A N  A S S O C IA T IO N
Office* tn MULtSMOt / FARWELL / FRIONA / LITTLEFIELD H
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OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word • $.09 
2nd and add., per word - $.00 

NATIONAL RATES 
1st insertion, per word • $.11 
2nd and add., per word - $.07 
Minimum Charge • $.50 
CARD OF THANKS - $3.00 
Classified Display - $1.25 per 

column inch.
Double Rate for Blind Ads - 
DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
Noon Tuesday for Thursday 
Noon Friday for Sunday 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY, REVISE OR 
REJECT ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD HAS 
RUN ONCE.

HARVEST TIME 
OPPORTUNITY SALE: 

HOUSE 1812 West Avenue H. 
Richland Hills, Brick. 3 bed­
room, 2'/i baths. Separate 
family - study and dining 
rooms. Many extra special 
features inside, outside. 3,000 
plus square feet. 100' x 140’ 
lot. /

Jessica P. Hall 
7707 Broadway. No. 7 

San Antonio, Tex. 78209 
or AC 512-824-6874 

For local appointment call 
272-3352

8-41s tfc

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 20 acres 
irrigated land. 2 miles from 
Muleshoe. Phone 272-5578 or 
after 6 phone 272-3658.
8-38t-tfc
9 Automobiles

WANT A CLASSIC? For sale 
1965 Mustang, 6 cylinder, 3 
speed in the floor, with air, very 
clean, kept waxed, new tires, 
and in good shape. Asking 
$1050. Make an offer. Royce 
Clay 272-4790 or 272-3070. 1628 
West Avenue C.
9-48s-3tc

Personal I

FOR SALE: 356 acres, good 
allotments, good yields. 1-6” 
well. 1-8” well. Call 946-3604.

PTL (PRAISE THE LORD) 
Channels 28 and 3. 8:30 - 10:30 
a.m. Monday through Friday. 
l-12s-tfc

FOR YOUR Stanley Home Pro­
ducts, Jewel Broyles, call 965- 
2481.
1-16t-tfc

SALES, LOANS 
AND

APPRAISALS
In Bailey County 30 Years 

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE

210 S. 1st

10 Farm Equipment
Your neighbors trade at STATE 
LINE IRRIGATION for all their
irrigation needs. Why not you? 
Muleshoe, Littlefield, & Level-

'land. .............
1 10-45s-tfc w

FOR SALE: American corn dry­
er. Gas heater. 7'/j gear box. 
7'/i HP motor with fan. $2000.
892-2905.
10-49s-2tc

3 Help  Wanted

NEEDED: Manager for fast 
food outlet in Bailey County. 
Call 806-364-4661.
3-49t-2tc

HELP WANTED: Approximate­
ly eight men for plant and 
elevator work. Prefer experi­
ence or willing to learn. Several 
different pay scales for different 
jobs ranging from $3.60 per 
hour to $4.55. Contact Protein 
Processors, four miles east of 
Muleshoe, Tex., Hwy 84. Phone 
965-2811. 
l-48t-tfc

4EED WOMAN TO babysit in 
ny home. Four days a week, 
’hone 272-4477 or come by 421 
Vest Eighth,
-49s-tfc

WE NEED MEN
ull or part time. Due to 
icreased production we need 
vo full time and two part time 
icn. Must be over 18 and have 
ir. No experience necessary, 
pply Monday, December 6. 
1:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon, 4:00 
m. to 7:00 p.m. See Mr. 
irdwell. Valley Motel, Room 14 
• call 272-3192, extension 14. 
49s-2tsc

160 acres, on pavement, two 
wells, sprinkler goes. */: miner­
als. West of Muleshoe.

Wingo Real Estate 
143 N. Westside Ave.

Littlefield, Texas 
Phone 806-385-4684 

Carol Brooks ... 385-5194 
Mildred Wingo ... 385 4684 
8-49s-8tc

11 For Sale Or Tradd

FOR SALE: 80 acres exelu-
sive. ‘A Minteral 8" well.
Underground pipe, 
land.

Level

HOLLAND REAL ESTATE
113 West Avenue D

Phone 272-3293
Day or Night

8-38s-tfc

FOR SALE: PVC pipe and 
fittings. ’A inch through 10 inch. 
STATE LINE IRRIGATION - 
LEVELLAND, LITTLEFIELD 
AND MULESHOE.
I l-41s-tfc

FOR SALE: 15'/: ft. Red Dale 
Camper Trailer. Like new, with 
load leveler hitch. Phone 272- 
4343 after 6.
II -46s-tfp

FOR SALE: 160 acres NE-V. 
Section 51. Block Y, W.D. and 
S.W. Johnson subdivision. Two 
mHes north of Muleshoe just off 
Friona highway. 3 irrigation 
wells. $650 acre. Phone 806/ 
744-8638 or 214/742-8771. 
8-47t-8tc

Catalina Stereo with AM-FM 
radio. Pecan cabinet. Mediter- 
anian style. $249.95. 90 day 
warranty.

Gordon Wilson Appl. 
Phone 272-5531

11 -45s-4tsc

FOR SALE: 73 Bowlin mobile 
home. Two bedroom, two baths. 
14 x 72. Take over payments, 
$109. Call 4736 or 4990.
I l-47s-8tc

House 222 Fast Elm, 2 bed­
room, I y« bath, spacious din­
ing and living rooms. Many 
extra features. 272-4605. 
8-47t-tfc

FOR SALE:
motorcycle.
2178.
I l-49s-4tc

1974
3100

Yamaha 250 
miles. 965-

LARGE LOT IN Richland Hills. 
Bv owner. 272-4047 after 4:00. 
8-49t-2tp

15 Misce l laneous

Wanted To Rent

7ANT TO RENT or by 240 - 480 
■res in Pleasant Valley, Laz- 
jddie or Clay's Corner com- 
iunity. Be willing to buy equip- 
ent. Call 965-2842.
49s-8tc

P'OR SALE: 180 acres for sale. 
Eight miles west of Muleshoe 
Dn south side of highway 84. 
Three irrigation wells. 

Smallwood Real Estate 
116 E. Avenue C 
Muleshoe, Texas

Want to buy houses and build­
ings to be moved.

J.V. Privett & Son 
House Movers 

Phone 505-356-4990 
Portales, N.M. 

15-40t-tfc

I Rea l  Estate

3R SALE: 160 acres: 11 miles 
est - 4 miles north of Portales: 

irrigation wells. 70 acres 
falfa. hay shed, allotments: 
:anut, cotton, corn, 4 bedroom 
>use. tenant house. Phone 
15-356-8160.
4ls-tfc

FOR SALE: Bargain. Beautiful 3 
bedroom home, large paved 
corner lot, with 2 car garage and 
storage. Fenced back yard. Has 
nice kitchen, den, lots of cabi­
nets. built in cook stove and bar. 
Wall paneled and large closets. 
New carpet and paint. See at 
1212 West Avenue B or call 
272-3477.
8-49t-6tc

Jood 3 bedroom house. Well 
ocated.
32 acres irrigated near Mule 

*hoe.
Sec. of irrigated land near 

-riona.
V* Sec. of land in Lamb 

bounty. Well irrigated.
POOL REAL ESTATE 
214 L. AMER.BLVD. 

272-4716
l-45s-tfc

Bargain! 15 acres with nice 3 
bedroom home. Large’ hay 
barn. 'A mile off highway neat 
Muleshoe.

J.B. Sudderth Realty, Inc. 
Box 627 

far well, Texas 
481-3288

8-3St-tfc

ATTENTION HUNTERS 
AND TRAPPERS

Fur buyer will be in Mule­
shoe at Winston’s Etna each 
Friday from 12:15 p.m. till 
12:45 p.m. beginning Novem­
ber 26, 1976.

We buy green and dry furs of 
all kinds. Skin case all fur (like 
oppossunts), not open up the 
middle. We also buy deer 
hides! Well handled furs bring 
TOP PRICES!

Northwestern Fur Co.
Colorado City. Texas 

15-48t-3tp

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 MAIN

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments. new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.

Phone: 505-763-5041. 
15-30s-tfc

IFOR SALE: Pace and Powelll 
[radios. Base and mobiles.! 
Is 120 and up. Call 272-3163. 
115-15s-«fc

FOR SALE: 16” well casing, 
new steel 18" 2c a lb.; 6" and 
8 column pipe. lA prices for 
junk iron.

FARWELL PIPE A IRON 
601 AVENUE A 

FARWELL, TEXAS
15-46t-tfc

WANTED: Feasant lease, 5 or 6 
guns, December II and 12. Call
272-4536.
15-48t-tfp

WANTED: Land to lease or buy.
Phone 965-2665.
l5-47t-tfc

Grapefruit Pill with Diadax, eat 
satisfying meals and lose 
weight, now extra strength for­
mula. Western Drug.
15-48s-3tsp

17 S e e d A  Feed

FOR SALE: Baled wheat straw. 
Call 272-4411.
17-46s-6tsc

R E A L  E S T A T E
FRESHMEN GIRLS BASKETBALL . . . Coach Bob Graves and his 
outstanding freshman girls basketball team are shown immediately 
before the Muleshoe-Olton game last week. The girls are racking up

a winning season. Coach Graves is assisted in coaching chores by 
Ronnie Jones, assistant principal and coach from Muleshoe Junior 
High.

F A R M * H O M MR A N C H E S
FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
3ath. Avenue E and 7th 
5treet. Now at reduced Price.

J O H N  W. S M IT H  2 7 1 -4 S 7 S
W .  M.

8-45s-2tc

Water Use Efficiency Key To Plant Growth

ON RAY SALARY
A federal judge has dis­

missed three private suits 
filed to collect shares of 
the $14,000 yearly govern­
ment salary paid Elizabeth 
Ray when she was former 
Rep. Wayne Hays’ mistress.

Early investigations by a Texas 
Agricultural Experiement Sta­
tion scientist at Lubbock may 
unlock a number of secrets 
about plant use of water, a 
finding which could lead to 
improved drought tolerant crops 
such as cotton and sorghum. 
The key is the existence of a 
“ relationship between root zone 
carbon dioxide concentrations 
and water use of the plants".

If preliminary studies hold up, 
scientists may be able to devel-

Nitrate Pollution 
Can Be Avoided
A team of agricultural research 

scientists investigating fertilizer 
nitrate movement into shallow 
underground water areas fol­
lowing crop irrigation say ni­
trate pollution can be avoided.
The study, under the direction 

of Drs. Art Onken, soil chemist; 
Charles Wendt, soil physicist; 
and Otto Wilke, agricultural 
engineer, all with the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Station 
at Lubbock, was one of a
number of research papers pre-

.....■■"

Three Way 
School Menu

December 6 -10 -1976 
MONDAY
Breaded Cutlets with Gravy
Mashed Potatoes
Green Beans
Salad
Hot Rolls
White Cake
Apple Sauce
Milk
TUESDAY
Hamburgers 
French Fries 
Tomatoes - Lettuce 
Onions - Pickles 
Bun
Sliced Peaches 
Milk
WEDNESDAY
Enchiladas 
Pinto Beans 
Carrot Sticks 
Pear Half 
Cornbread 
Gingerbread 
With Lemon Filling 
Milk
THURSDAY
Beef Stew-
Vegetables
Jello
Fruit Salad
Onions
Cornbread
Brownies
Milk
FRIDAY
Fish - Tarter Sauce
Potato - Cheese Salad
Chopped Broccoli Salad
Cornbread
Apple Crisp
Milk

sented Thursday, December 2, 
before the annual meeting of the 
American Society of Agronomy 
(ASA).
About 3.000 agronomists from 
across the nation met in Hous­
ton for the five-day event No­
vember 28 - December 2, which 
featured a joint meeting of the 
ASA, Crop Science Society of 
America and Soil Science Soci­
ety of America.
The research. Onken told the 

group- employed three difim-ont 
types of irrigation systems in­
cluding furrow, sprinkler and 
sub-irrigation, in a crop of sweet 
corn. The crop was planted in 
permeable soil overlying a shal­
low water table.

"Nitrogen fertilizer enriched 
with a naturally occurring heavy 
isotope of nitrogen was used in 
order that fertilizer movement 
could be traced,” he reported. 
“ In two growing seasons the 
sweet corn was fertilized in the 
normal fashion at a rate of about 
100 pounds of nitrogen per acre.
Fertilizer moved to greatest 

depths under sprinkler irriga­
tion and least under sub-irriga­
tion, Onken said.

“ While it was apparent that 
some fertilizer nitrogen moved 
below the root zone under 
sprinkler and furrow irrigation, 
the concentrations were much 
less than limits set by state 
health departments for drinking 
water,” he added. “ This re­
search shows that with proper 
management of fertilizer and 
irrigation water, movement of 
fertilizer nitrogen into under­
ground strata can be control­
led.”

More than 1,100 voluntary 
research papers were presented 
from Monday through Thursday 
in sessions planned by the three 
societies' 21 subject matter 
divisions. In addition to these 
voluntary papers, several prom­
inent members were invited to 
present landmark papers about 
the historical highlights and 
future perspectives of scientists 
in the respective divisions.
The three science societies are 

educational organizations with 
more than 8,500 members 
throughout the U.S. and more 
than 90 foreign countries.

Weather Master Seed 
Dealer

Interstate Fertilizer 
Farwell, Texas

Area Representatives

Max Crim
Clays Corner  

Hub
Muleshoe
965-2742

Betsy Stone
Am he rst 
246-3616 
Sudan  

Littlefield

op plants that use their energy 
resources in leaf and fruit 
development rather than in 
excess root activity.
The study was revealed Thurs­

day afternoon, December 2, in 
Houston before the annual 
meeting of the American Society 
of Agronomy by Dr. Charles 
Wendt, soil physicist with the 
Experiment Station at Lubbock. 
Wendt joined some 3,000 other 

agronomists from around the 
nation in Houston, November 28 
through December 2 for the 
joint annual meetings of the 
American Society of Agronomy, 
Crop Science Society of America 
and the Soil Science Society of 
America.
Wendt's research was carried 

out under greenhouse condi­
tions, using plant containers 
equipped for moisture and gas 
measurements, with Olton loam 
soil topped with vermicullite. 
This latter material was to 
minimize evaporation, yet allow 
free gas exchange between soil 
and atmosphere.

When significant changes in 
soil water potential occurred, 
measurements of transportation 
and root zone carbon dioxide 
(C02) were made, Wendt re­
ported. Soil water potential was 
measured with tensiometers 
and with themocouple psychro- 
nieters at potentials less than 
those in the tensiometer range. 
Transpiration was determined 
from pot weights. Samples of 
the soil gases were obtained 
with a gas syringe from an 
aluminum tube with a rubber 
cap, and were analyzed with an 
infrared analyzer. Since the 
plants were in an advanced 
stage of growth, leaf area 
measurements of each plant 
were made with a leaf area 
meter.
Wendt said that the relation­

ships between soil and transpi­
ration of all plant species were 
all found to be significant. 
Major differences were found 
among plant species in the 
amount of water they transpired 
at a given root zone C02 
concentration. For instance, cot­
ton, w hich is reputed to be more 
drought tolerant than sorghum, 
transpired more at a particular 
C02 concentration.

"It may be possible that the 
more drought tolerant plants 
transpire more water and have 
less root respiration (giving off 
of C02) per unit leaf areas," 
Wendt reports. "Consequently,

such plants may use less sugar 
manufactured by the plant in 
root respiration."

Wendt interprets this conclu­
sion has having a number of 
implications for the develop­
ment of drought tolerant crops.

“ What we might look for," he 
says, "are plants that utilize 
their energy resources of sun 
and water most efficiently in 
leaf and fruit development ra­
ther than in root activity.” 

“ Studies under more control­
led conditions,” he says, “ could 
answer many questions that 
arose during the study, such as 
what the contribution of the soil 
is to the root zone C02 concen­
tration, and what the role of root 
respiration is in transpiration. 
"One major advantage of C02 

measurements,” Wendt adds, 
“ is that the same instrument

can be used throughout the 
range of active plants while in 
soil water potential measure­
ments it is necessary to use two 
separate instruments to cover 
the soil range in which plants 
are active.”
The soil physicist says that the 

major limiting factor in his 
studies is that other soil para­
meters such as organic water, 
dead plants, and soil minerals 
contribute to the C02 level in 
the soil.

If the contribution of these 
parameters can be delineated, 
measurement of root zone C02 
could be used to measure root 
activity as influenced by plant 
growth and soil and plant treat­
ments, and to delineate differ­
ences in root activity between 
cultivars within the plant spe­
cies.

I P I
G L E N  W A T K I N S  

Lorl et  Exchange

9 2 5 - 6 7 4 3

WasherWon’t Wash 

Dryer Won’t Dry 

Freezer Won’t Freeze 

T.V. Won’t Work 

C.B. Won’t Modulate

Microwave Oven 

Need Repair?
For Service

Call 272-5531

Wilson Appliance  
117 Main 

Muleshoe, Texas
» o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o e o o o o o o o e o <

$250,000 AUCTION
IRRIGATION ACCESSORIES

10: 30 A.IK December 11,  1976
PVC FITTINGS-6,000 PIECES
'Underground Irrigation)
4-5-6-H-10-12 15 inch sizes
1 int* Tret. 45-90 degree Fils. Tec Bottoms. 
Adaptors. Repair Slips,
( oupiers and more
Hi,h Prrtturv a„it FSr„urv

PIERCE FITTINGS-2,200 PIECES
Couplers. Hold Bands Band Latches.
Catches. Valve Stubs. Fils.
Plugs. Tees, Line Valves and more
2 1-4-5-6-? 8-10 inch si/cs

EEiTON FITTINGS- 8,000 PIECES
ll nTO)

Fils. Ices. Couplers, Hand Latches.
Caskets, Hugs. FI! Valves.
Valve Openers. Fu 
2 1 4-S 6-and 8 inch sizes

RERK1EY AND PENNING PUMPS
4-5 h Inch Sizes
50 Component Parts Primers. Diaphragms.
Check Valves. Shafts.
Strainers, and Foot Halves
150 Feel of Pump Hose (5” -6” -8")

PVC HTTING-5,500 PIECES
'Sewer and Water Sizes)
Couplers. Plugs Tees. 22.5-45-90 degree Elbow* 
Y s. Male Adaptors. Reducers and more

SIDE RQUS-40,000 PIECES
10 Gifford Hill Side Rolls <5 * 05")
Assembled Wheels 4 * 60. 5 x 60. 5 x h5. and 5 * 7f>. 
Pieces Hubs. Spokes. Cleats Motors. Levelers.
Fie* Couplers, Flange Adapters. Gaskets, and 
Engine Covers

ALUMINUM PIPE
Assorted Sizes and Types

MISCELLANEOUS ACCESSORIES
250 Feel of Flex Hoses. Vent Gaskets. 
Aluminum“4-tjaies. Draw bands <I0" I2"-I5” ). 

Assorted sizes of Sprinkler Adaptors. Galvmi/ed 
Risers. .1 aod 4 inch Air Relief Valves. Lock Seal Gaskets. 
Mechanical Joint Adaptors. Tee Valve Openers.
Steel Valve Covers. Steel Collars. 650 Rain Bird 
Sprinklers. Thousands of Sprinkler Nozzles and 
Thousands more items to numerous to mention

AUCTIONEERS NOTE: This sale represents a large selection of irrigation accessories Gentlemen, 
here's an opportunity to restock your inventories with NEW merchandise. This sale has too many 
items to describe in this ad. So. be with us this day • December II. 1976 at 10:30 a m.

GIFF0RD-HIU AND COMPANY 242S MARSHALL LUBBOCK, TEXAS

PUBLIC AUCTIONS
T E R M S  C a sk  et Chech W f  HELP LO AD  W H A T  W f  S f U lm*f Tour Own Checkbook

A ll  Announcem ents M o d e  A t  These So les Supersede Any Prior Announcem ents

■ US (AC to t )  1 *6  4446 R IS  (106) 966 4250 P .0  IO X  297 W O LFFO RTH . TKXAS 793R2
D A N N Y BURNS, B44-4640 K EVIN  HU TSON . 864 4303
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Thanksgiving holiday guests in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Roy Fisher were their children. 
Lt. Com. Radney Fisher of 
Phoenix. Ariz., Kathey of Hart, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fisher 
and children of Ralls.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Art Lynch and 

Jennifer visited in Missouri with 
relatives during the Thanksgiv­
ing holidays.

Holiday visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. D.W. Williamson 
were their son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Earl William­
son and Dusty of Vernon. Their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Pat Minyard and girls of 
Brownwood arrived Sunday to 
visit with them and his mother, 
Mrs. Rhoda Minyard.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Drum and 
children of Cado Mills arrived 
Thursday morning for Thanks­
giving with her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Tersterman, her bro­
ther, Freddie, and grandpar­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Maxwell.

* * * * *
Mrs. Maureen Barnett, Mrs. 

Lucy Kent and Phil were in Ft. 
Worth during the holidays to be 
with their mother and grandmo­
ther, Mrs. Ewing. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Sorrells and son of Quinlan 
met them there.

Philip Gordon has returned 
home from the hospital where 
he underwent surgery recently. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Gustin 

and girls were in Six Flags 
during the Thanksgiving holi­
days.

* * * * *
Damon Provence was near 

Colorado during the holidays for 
deer hunting with his brother- 
in-law, Billy Jack Wood of 
O'Donnell.

Mr. and Mrs. B.A. Beauchamp 
Jr. and Derwin visited during 
the Thanksgiving holidays in 
Hobbs, N.M. with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Myrick and Mrs. Mary 
Clary.

* * * * *
Cheryll Harvey of Howard 

Payne University in Brownwood 
visited during the holidays in 
the home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Halbert Harvey and 
Dennis.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Morris and 

boys of Grants. N.M. returned 
Sunday to their home after 
visiting here during the holidays 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Morris and Dr. and Mrs. 
Thurmon Bryant.

* * * * *
Thanksgiving holiday guests in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Milton Williams were their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Sherman and daughter of Hous­
ton and Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Hill and boys of Plainvicw. 

* * * * *
Butch Dykes of California visit­

ed during the holidays in the

home of his parents, m and 
Mrs. Hubert Dykes.

* * * * *
Mrs. Lura Fife and T.W. were 

in Junction during the Thanks­
giving holidays to be their son 
and brother, Mr.a nd Mrs. 
Orbie Earl Fife and family. 

* * * * *
Dick Roark of Almagordo visit­

ed here last week with his 
parents and stayed at the hospi­
tal some with his father, Olan, 
who was rehospitalized.

* * * * *
Mrs. Mary Olds and Bertha 

Vereen were in Lovington, N.M. 
during the holidays to be with 
their sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Faris.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Bingham of 

Lubbock were holiday visitors in 
the home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lewis Fields.

* * * * •
Mrs. Rose Pinkerton was in 

Littlefield recently to visit with 
her sister and brother-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. H.O. Bigham. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Ingle and

the holidays to be with her 
grandmother.

*  *  *  *  *

Mrs. Edna Bellamy returned 
home Saturday from Ontario, 
Canada where she visited with 
her son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronald ellamy and son, 
Ronald. On the way home, she 
visited in Dallas with another 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Gus Ed 
Bellamy.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Knox 
were in Muleshoe Thanksgiving 
Day with her grandmother and 
other relatives.

• * • • •
Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Knox were 

in Lubbock Sunday to visit with 
their new granddaughter, Wen­
dy Jo, and her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Knox.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Dorsey were 
in Carlsbad. N.M. visited rela­
tives during the holidays. 

* * * * *
Thanksgiving visitors in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. Claude 
Kropp were their children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles, Minchcw and

boys; Mr. and Mrs. John Kropp 
and children; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Butch Waller and children, and 
Oliver Waller Hart.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Hayes 

and Tracey of Austin visited 
during the Thanksgiving holi­
days with her aunt, Miss Ruby 
Mince.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Graves were 

in Ft. Sill, Okla. recently to visit 
with their new granddaughter, 
Leslie Deanne Graves, and her 
parents, S/Sgt. and Mrs. Rex 
Graves.

* * ***
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Graves were 

in Euless during the Thanksgiv­
ing holidays to visit their daugh­
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Randal Gilcrease.

* * * * *
Louise Parrish returned home 

over the weekend from the 
Amherst Hospital where she 
was a medical patient.

*  *  *  • •

Viki Doty was in Lubbock 
Wednesday where she visited 
her cousin, Jo Gaye.

* * * * *

Mrs. Ima Olds returned home 
Thanksgiving Day from South 
Plains Hospital in Amherst. 

* * * * *
Susan Cardwell spent the holi­

days with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Cardwell.

• * * * •
Mr. and Mrs. Guy Walden 

spent the Thanksgiving holidays 
in Ft. Worth with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jackie Van Ness and girls.

• *  *  *  •

Miss Rhonda Gatewood accom­
panied the Don Graves family of 
Muleshoe to Ft. Worth where 
they spent the Thanksgiving 
holidays.

Jo Gaye and David Doty of 
Lubbock spent Thanksgiving 
with their aprents,' Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne Doty and Donald. 

* ****
Mrs. Edith Williams visited 

Friday with her sister and 
brother-in-law, Mr.a nd Mrs. 
Bill Cook of Littlefield.

• * • • •
Greg Harper and his cousin, 

Kevin Sinclair of Amarillo, 
spent the Thanksgiving holidays

at Tres Ritos, N.M.
• • • • •

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Don Parrot 
and family of Amarillo visited 
during the holidays with her 
mother, Mrs. D.W. Muller.

• * * • •
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Beadle took 

Maude Alexander to Slaton 
Thursday for Thanksgiving din­
ner with her daughter, Mr.a nd 
Mrs. O.B. Chambers.

• * * • •
Mrs. Dale Weaver and Mrs. 

Alane Bishop of Amherst visited 
here Sunday with their mother 
and grandmother, Mrs. Edith 
Williams.

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bridwell 
were in Canyon for Thanksgiv­
ing with their son and family, 
the Jerry Bridwells.

* * * * *
Mrs. Noble Dudgeon and boys 

were in Graham during the 
holidays where they visited her 
mother, Mrs. Francis Blair.

• *  *  • •

Agreement r eached,  
Chrysler strike is off.

fe, E T  d AJMK VAULT m l\l
C* to may you May WIN *1000

loch advfrtiMd 'toms i» rt«U'r#3 10Of 'oad'ir a*a.Ubit sate at or b*io» the advarbtad e'ce m each ttero «>c«pi atspecifically no*ad m »•» ad

Prices good thru Dec. 8, 1976.
We reserve the right to limit quantities. 
None sold to dealers.

_  * m n n t .\ is  f s t \ n n t t f *

Miracle 
Whip

j  ,t i r .

GAME NUMBER OF PRI2ES OODS FOR ONE GAME PIECE ODOS FOR 13 GAME PIECES ODOS FOR 26 GAME PIECES
St 000 §2 1 m 121.822 1 tbf.379 t m 4 689
$100 96 1 in 101.644 1 m 9.357 1 in 4.179 ]
$50 tss 1 m SO 961 1 m 4.689 1 ,n 2,345 1
$20 444 I in 24.714 1 in 1 901 1 m 951
$10 188 1 in 12.357 1 m 951 1 m 475
$$ 5 001 1 m 2 194 I in 189 1 in 84
$2 7,124 1 >• 1 403 1 m 108 t in 54
$1 29.291 1 hi 375 1 in 29 1 in 14

TOTAL 41.792 1 in 250 t in 1* 1 in 10
Thit P ro f ram it available at 110 Piggly Wiggly *«or#» located m  Toiaa. New M o n c o  and 
Oklahoma Schtdvlad  termination dala of thit Program n  January 15 1977 but gam t officially 
terminate* with distribution of all gam a pieces Thu  Program may bo repeated by popular

Gama p ie c t*  and game folders may bo otrtamod froo by writing Bank Vault Bingo. Program No 
478. P 0 B o i 5 0 5 5  Dallas f taa t  75222  Only on * game piece and game 'older may bo 
requested per envelop* and a sort addressed stamped envelope must accom pany each rt 
quest

MEAT BUYS MEAT BUYS
a. ^ EVERYDAY LOW PR ICE EVERYDAY LOW PRICE

Shoulder

Arm Roast
Skinned, Sliced & Deveined

Lb.
$118

Beef Liver 69c
I E A N M E A T Y  BONELESS

STEW MEAT »9V
Country Style Fresh Pork A O

Spare Ribs » s108
Swift’s Can (9 Ham Patties)

Ham $199
Patties 2,cV„ I21-oz.

Can

Hormel

Little Sizzlers 'is 99c
Skinless. Defatted w i w A

Smoked Picnics > /  /
Hormel Wieners 0 4  > IC I

Wranglers - I
Kraft American f f j j  9 Q
Cheese Slices ; *1
Farmer Jones

Sliced 
Bologna

Biscuit Mix

Bisquick
Cereal

Wheat Chex

G s s i
Pouches §

15-oz. 
Box

Grape Jam or

Smuckers Jelly 79c
Assorted Flavors

Wagner
Drinks 54-oz.

Btl. 69*

Piggly Wiggly Bartlett

Pear Halves 2i6-oi 7QC
Cans /  ^

6 9 *
Golden Best

Tomatoes O 16-oz. $1 
Q j  Cans |

69*
Mixed Vegetables Larsen's

Veg-All Q 16-oz. S i 0 Cans 1
Van Camp's White or Golden

Hominy
Cream or Whole Kernel

Del Monte 
Corn

2 49c

3 I I
4 STORE MANAGERS SALE

East Texas Sugary

Sweet Yams

Ocean Spray, Fresh

Cranberries u.CQC
put. ||g

Almonds, Brazil Nuts or

Walnuts .79c
California

Anjou Pears 49c
G o ld e n

Ripe
Bananas 5*1

"N

Frozen Foods
Piggly Wiggly

Whipped i  

Topping;, 49*
Piggly Wiggly

Pie Shells 2 Pack Q Q C
9 oe Pkg

Pet Ritz

Fruit Cobblers 26 oz Q Q C
F’kg g g

All Varieties Freezer Queen

Suppers 2-Lb. $ 4  39 
Pkg. 1

Health <6 Beauty Aids
$159

Natural pH Balance

Earth Born 
Shampoo
Tame Conditioner

Creme
Riose
Regular Advance Look

Toni Perm
Non-Aarosol Hair Spray Adorn

Firm ft Free
Adorn

Hair 8 pray
Earth Born Conditioner and

Creme Rinse

12-01. 
Btl

8-oe.
Btl. 99c

$|99  

$*|99 

$*|97 

$*|19

Box

8 or
Btl

13-01.
Can

8-oz
Btl

Special Hays

$149
W-1452, Retail Value $2.89

Square 
Cake Dish 8-ln.

buggesied  Retail w  o *  suggested  rteiaii e sc  m

Pie Plate »» 8 1 39Ranger Mug V; 49c
Suggested Rotail 49c f k a t p  Suggested Rafail 79c

Custard -  Z9C Mixing Bowl.69c
Suggested Rafail 16 99 *  a * *  Suggatltd  Rafail S I  19 a * A P

Oval Roaster 3 . * 4 "  Mixing Bowl vi  89c
Suggested Rafail $1 49 A M *

Mixing Bowl 2 > . 99c

Delta Paper

T owels
2  9 9 8

Piggly Wiggly Noodl* a *

Chicken Soup 9 ,rss *1
Sunshine Crackers -  59°
Betty Crocker Choc. Fudge or Creamy White

Frosting Mix '  £ 79c
30-Ct. Daytime or 24 Ct. Extra Absorbent a  * * *  n

Kimbles Diapers » SZ19
Delta

Bath
Tissue 4 Roll 

Pkg.


