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GENE SCHOENROCK 
Marshal

Plains Voters Turn 
Out In Good Quanity

Plains voters, turning out in 
higher than usual qua'ties, r e ­
elected unopposed, incumbent 
mayor Roy A. Edwards with a 
vote o f  193 out o f  207 votes.

T. J. Bearden and T, J. Miller 
were elected to the posts o f  
city councilmen. They were 
opposed by Darrell Lindsey and 
Doyle Newson, Jr. Votes talli­
ed as follows: Bearden 167: 
Miller, 118; Lindsey, 33, and 
Newsom, 74.

Gene Schoenrock won the 
Marshall's race with 152 votes 
against Burton Tingle with 30 
votes.

Other members o f  the City 
Council are Frank W hitlock, 
James Warren and Bill Loyd.

The new councilmen and ma­
rshall were sworn in by Mayor 
Edwards when the Council met 
in regular session Tuesday ni­
ght at City HalL

Business included the hiring 
o fA . E. Godwin to replacethe 
vacancy left by Pete Green at 
the City Light Plant. Mrs. Lo­
retta Houck, clerk, was granted 
a $25 a month raise, raisingher 
salary to $250 a month.

The canvas o f  the recent e l­
ection was studied and appro­
ved.

Mayor Edwards made the an­
nouncement that Du Point re­
presentatives will be at the 
April 23 meeting to acquaint 
the new city council on the 
soft water project being cond­
ucted here.

Those attending Tuesday's 
meetingwereEdwards, Miller 
Bearden, Schoenrock, Whitl­
ock, Loyd, Warren, Billy Ke­
nnedy, Betty Livesay, City Se 
cretary and W. B. Scott, pla­
nt supervisor.

Six men were seeking four 
positions on the School Board 
and winners were Lee Roy Me 
Cravey, 209; H. W. (Curley) 
Taunton, 179; Dickie Green, 
179; W. G. (Bill) Gray, 176. 
Harvev Romans received 123 
votes and Garland H. Swann 
received 118.

Intherecent Denver City e l­
ections, a total o f  636 votes 
were cast in the councilman 
race. The votes tallied as fol­
lows ; J. M. Trent, 420; John 
Wise, 398; Lloyd Deets, 395 ; 
Gene Snyder, 335; E. W. Bull­
ock, 325¡and Roy Akin, 281.

In the school election 400 
votes were cast. They tallied 
as follows: Dr. Squyers, 340; 
Mac Bradley, 233; andW. Pa- 
rdue, 189.
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ALL READY FOR THE HUNT

CITY POSTS

Students Bring Home
Honors From Events
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in Plains High is active in all 
athletics and U. L L. events. 
He is also a member o f  the 
Science Club.

County Clerk, Ruby Heald, 
made a correction for absent­
ee voting from last week's pa­
per by stating that absentee 
voting will begin Tuesday, Ap­
ril 16, as the courthouse will 
be closed Monday, April 15, in 
observation o f  Easter.The vot­
ing will continue through 5p. m. 
April 30.

Commissioners Court met in 
regular session Monday with 
Judge Bennett residing.

Businesss included approving 
the County School Trustee e l­
ection held April 6 be canva­
ssed as follows: Carl Lowrey, 
17 and B. J. Dupree, 160.

The court also approved the 
County Treasurer's quarterly 
report.

A bid from La mesa Printing 
was accepted in the amount o f 
$499 less $100 trade-in or bal­
ance o f  $399 for calculator to 
be used in the County Auditor's 
Office.

MARRIAGE LICENSES

April 5: Danny Elbert Harber- 
Deborah Faye Cundiff.
April 6; Steven Earl Milam- 
Cydney Rudean Moorehead.

THOMAS BEARDEN 
Councilman

207 voters

Women In 
Lubbock Meet

Five members o f  the Yoak­
um County Women's Cotton 
Promotion Club were in Lubb­
ock Thursday when materials 
and a plan promoting cotton 
on the High Plains were pres­
ented to industry leaders.

Thoseattendingwere Mmes. 
Carl Lowrey, president o f  the 
local club; Roy Lowrey, David 
Stowe; Kent Welch, H. W. Ta­
unton and Mrs. W. L. Stephens 
o f Brownfield.

Organized through the fram­
ework o f Cotton Producers In­
stitute and the National Cotton, 
the meeting kicks o ff a Belt­
wide campaign to increase the 
sale o f  cotton through intensive 
local promotions.

A hand book prepared by the 
Council was described in det­
ail. E  suggests prodedures to 
assist loca l groups in promoting 
cotton through retailers, indu­
stry organizations and womens 
clubs.

It also describes available 
materials such as newspaper ad 
layouts, kits for schools, billb­
oard sheets, bumper strips and 
lists to guide buyers in stock ­
ing cotton products.

Representatives o f  the Coun­
c il outlined the local promot­
ional effort and also reviewed

the $8 -m illion  research and 
promotion program mf Cotton 
Producers Institue.

Howard Alford, Lubbock, vi­
ce president od CPI, pointed up 
the additional impact the nat- 
tional effort can be given the- 
ough strong local campaigns.

Roy Forkner, also o f  Lubbock, 
and a trustee of CPI, stressed 
the program would be an ind­
ustrywide effort, drawing on 
the support o f  allied groups as 
well.

"We feel it's tim e we were 
doing more here at home to 
encourage purchases o f  cotton 
products, "he explained, "and 
this program is designed to get 
more cotton products stocked 
by retailer and sold to consu - 
mwrs. "

Mrs. E. L. McDowell o f  Cro­
sby County, and active worker 
in organizing the Women's Co­
tton Clubs in  the High Plains 
area,said cotton still has more 
to offer in comfort, maintena­
nce, and durability and the pr­
ogram and materials introduced 
today provide valuable guide 
for telling this story.

Which of the Following is Spelled Correctly?

yoked yokal yokel
(Meaning: Plowboy.)

See Classified Page for Correct Answer.

Gravesideservices for Johnna 
Aron, infant daughter o f  Sgt. 
and Mrs. Joe Aron, formerly o f  
Denver City, were held at 3 
p. m. Monday in Gaines Coun­
ty Memorial Park.

Kenneth Board, minister o f  the 
Denver City First Christian Chu­
rch officiated. Singleton Funer­
al Home was in charge o f the 
arrangements.

The child was born April 1 in 
Seville, Spain and died April 2.

Surviving besides the parents 
are a sister, Karen, o f  the home, 
and grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mrs. Faye Smith o f  Seminole.

. DRIVER OF THE WEEK: Russell 
Jones, 17 year-old son o f Mr.& 
Mrs. T. Jo nes o f Rt. 1, Tokio, 
was named as Safe Driver ofthe 
Week Monday. Russell, a junior

Honors o f  all kinds were ac­
quired this week by Plains st­
udents in different com petit - 
ive district events.

The Cowboys took first in tr­
ack while the Cowgirls down­
ed Aspermont 15-2 and 15-1 for 
b i- district honors in V olleyball 

Plains High School finished 
first in U. L L, competition 
Saturday in Big Spring while 
the Junior and Elementary Sc­
hools students placed first.

Plains placed second with 39 
points behind Tahoka with 40 
points in district tennis play 
here Tuesday.

Placing in U. L L. com peti­
tion in the high school divis­
ion in different events are st­
udents as follows; 
Extemporaneous Speaking: 

Russell Jones, second; Debbie 
Chadwick, third.
Persuasive Speaking:

Billy Kennedy, first; Sheile 
Taunton, third.
Poetry Interpretation:

Terry Fitzgerald and Pam Ba­

rnett, third; Alton Me Ginty., 
fourth and Janet Sealy, fifth. 
Prose Reading:

Robert Field and Sharon Wi­
lliams, second; Joyce Warren, 
third and Lance Smith, fifth. 
Spelling and Plain Writing; 
Mary Moreno and Juanita Wa­
lker, second, as a team. 
Typewriting;

Robert Field, third and Y ol- 
ando Ramos, fourth.
Number Sense:

Russell Jones and Earl Freig, 
tie for first.
Science:

Russell Jones, second; La Ve­
rne Edwards, fourth; Billy Ke­
nnedy, fifth.
Slide Rule;

Billy Kennedy, first, Calvin 
Smith, second; Patrick Layton, 
third.

SEE HONORS 
PAGE 5

Top Honors
Five students from Plains High 

School have been named to the 
1968 edition o f Young Leaders 
o f  America.

Students nominated by their 
principal or senior class advi­
sor for inclusion in the edition 
were Dan Robert Field, Sherry 
Kay Miller, Calvin K. Smith, 
Sharon Kay Tarkington and 
Rodney Clyde Trout.

Thesestudents were nomina­
ted because they have used 
their talents, energy and abil­
ity and whose past achievem ­
ents have contributed to their 
school and community.

Annual Hunt 
Set Saturday

Kiddies Be Ready! The East­
er Bunny plans to make his an­
nual visit into Stanford Park 
Saturday morning at 10 a. m . . 
There w ill be prizes for the' 
lucky tiny tots who find the re­
ward eggs. This hunt is for pre­
school age children only.

Cordell Huddles ton,chairman 
o f  the hunt, is in charge and 
announces that it w ill get un­
derway at 10 a. m .The race for 
the eggs w ill start on time, so 
parents are urged to have the 
children at the park on time.

This w ill be the fourth ann­
ual Easter Egg Hunt sponsored 
by the Plains Chamber o f  Co­
mmerce. The hunt was started
when Roy McGehee was presi­
dent o f  the Chamber.

The entrances ofth e  park will 
be closed at 10 a. m. in order 
to protect the children from 
traffic hazzards. Parents are as­
ked to bring the cars inside be­
cause the entrances w ill close 
as soon as the hunt gets under­
way.

Three prize eggs will be off­
ered this year valued at $7. 50, 
$5. 00 and $2. 50. Children fi­
nding the prize eggs w ill rec­
eive checks Saturday morning.

Chamber members state the 
huntswere highly successful! 
in the past years and that the 
public has urged the Chamber 
to continue with the annual 
event.

Aron Infant’s 
Rites Monday

T. J. MILLER 
Councilman

Technical Action 
Panel Developed

RECORD
Don't know o f  anything I ev­

er enjoyed more than being ed- 
itorofthe Plains Record these 
past 4 months. But all good th­
ings must com e to an end.

When Mr. Hughes asked me 
to try to run the paper for him 
for awhile I thought he was jo ­
king. I tried to get him to get 
someone with experiencebut 
he couldn’t find anyone before 
he had to go on active duty, so 
I agreed to give it a try.

Every week has been a real 
challenge and I wouldn't take 
for the experience and for the 
wonderful fellowship with the 
merchants and all the people I 
have met and worked with in 
Plains.

I know we didn't get out the 
best paper in the world, but I 
was proud o f everyone o f them 
and would like to take this op­
portunity to thank everyone 
who helped make it possible to 
get a paper out every week. I 
would like to especially thank 
Mary Jane Norman, Beverly Cross

Teny Lester has been hired as 
Editor o f  the Plains Record. 
Teny,wife o f  Bobby Lester who 
farms near Tokio, has been 
employed with the record for 
about 3 months..

Before working for the Plains 
Record Teny was employed at 
the Brownfield Newspaper Off­
ice  as Society Editor,
The Lesters have 2 children, 

Cyndy and Bruce who both att­
end the Plains Schools. They 
have resided in Yoakum Coun­
tv for about 8 years.

Mrs. Lester replaces Ray Tr­
ent as editor. Trent has been 
editing the paper for Mr. Hug­
hes since December o f last year 

Mr. Joe Hughes, owner o f  the 
paper was called to serve 5 
months active duty in the Na­
tional Guard in December and 
is due to return to Plains a b o ­
ut May 10th.

Mr. Trent plans to devote 
more time to campaining for 
the Office o f  Tax Assessor and 
Collector.

Teny Lester and Cindy Vorheis. 
I could never made it w ith- 
out them.

Plains needs a good news pa­
per and I hope everyone will 
continue to support the paper 
as they have in the past.

I'm  glad that the paper will 
be in good hands o f  Teny les- 
ter and I 'm  sure that her and 
Cindy w ill do a real good job. 
They want me to keep on try­
ing to write this little o l ' we­
ekly column, but I 'll never kn­
ow why.

If the Plains Record ever ne­
eds me again I hope I'll be in 
a position to help them.

Guess I'D  better go before I 
start getting sentimental.

See you later,

Ray Trent.

Apologies
Offered

TENY LESTER 
Editor

New Editor 
For Paper

The Plains Record offers ap­
ologies to the hostess and Mrs. 
T. F. Fillinggim for omitting 
four names o f ones attending 
the surprise party for Mrs. Fi- 
llingim.

Names omitted were Reva 
Cleavelandl, Vers Smith, Mrs. 
W. M. Luna and Annette Cle­
veland. Mrs. Reva Cleveland 
also registered guest and gifts 
at the affair.

Notice
The District 5 -A One Act Pl­

ay Contest will be held today 
in the Plains High School A u ­
ditorium beginning at 1:30 p.m.

The public is invited to att­
end. Besides Plains,schools pa­
rticipating will be O'Donnell, 
Tahoka, Seagraves and Coah­
oma.

TECHNICAL ACTION PANEL MEMBERS

The United States Departm­
ent o f  Agriculture has a Tech­
nical Action Panel in each c o ­
unty. Panel members are a gr­
oup o f representatives o f  the 
various agricultural agencies 
and other related agencies.

The panel's responsibility 
and objevtive is to assist and 
extend their services to any in­
dividual or group in improving 
their community, or any pro­
ject that eill be o f  benefit to 
people in rural areas.

The panel members are o f  
the opinion that Yoakum Cou­
nty has a great potential far 
progress and improved profit in 
the further development o f  ag­
riculture and industrialization. 
There is also a need for impr­
oved housing and community

facilities.
The panel members are Ho­

mer P. C ole o f  the F. H. A., 
C. Murrell Thompson, Soil Co­
nservation Service, William M. 
Overton, Agricultural Stabili­
zation Conservation Service , 
frna in cooperation, Leo L. 
White, Yoakum County Agr­
icultural Agent and his progr - 
am building committee.

The panel meets regularly at, 
9 a. m. the second Tuesday of 
each month. They extend a n 
invitation to any individual or 
group to meet with, them and 
plan together for community 
development.

Some ot the items that can 
and should be w orked on are 
recreation, econom ics, indust­
ry and labor recources.

5 -A  Track

Cowboys Take First 
At District Meeting
With a determination to win, 

along with a strong overall ab­
ility, the Plains Cowboys cam e 
home Friday with the first pl­
ace trophy from the 5-A Dist­
rict Track Meet held in Coa- 
homa.

Plains led with a total o f  125 
points. Coahoma placed second 
with 113 1/2 points; O’ Donnell 
third with 91; Seagraves fourth 
with 84 1/2; and Tahoka fifth 
with 73.

Calvin Smith placed second 
in Pole Vault with 11 ft. 6 in. 
Donnie Moore o f  O’ Donnell, 
won first with 12ft. 4 1/2 in., a 
new record over the old o f  12 
ft. 1 3 /4  in. by Moore in the 
1967 meet.

Billy Taylor took second pl­
ace in the Discus event with a

ill I

April 9: George Edward Maul­
din-Carolyn Ann Crain.

DISTRICT COURT 
Cases Filed

J. B. Knight C o., Inc. vs. H&S 
Implement, collection  o f debt. 
Kit W illie Nelson vs. Texas 
Employment Ins. Ass. , Comp­
ensation.

DISPOSITION

C. B. McCan vs. Joan McCan, 
divorce granted.

Beverly Jones 
To Perform
Miss Beverly Jones, former Pl­

ains student, will participate 
in two concerts at the Hemis- 
fair 168 in San Antonio with 
the Hardin-Simmons Universi­
ty Concert Bands.

The spproximately 50 mem­
ber band under the direction o f 
Marion B. Me Clure will play 
at the Ampitheater at the He­
rn is fair.

throw o f 123 ft. 3 in. Bobbie 
Erving o f O'Donnell took first 
with 135 ft. 5 in . , breaking the 
old record o f  134 ft. 7 in. by 
James Jolly o f  Tahoka in 1965.

Smith took second in the Br­
oad Jumpwith 19-6 behind Cl­
iff  Thomas o f Tahoka with 
19-7 1/2.

Plains took first in the 440 
Yard Relay w ith a tim e o f  45. 5. 
Greg Jones, Smith, Joe Pierce 
and Dan Field made up the te­
am for this event. Coahome pl­
aced second with a tim e o f 45.55 

Billy Kennedy placed first in 
the 880 - Yard Run with a time 
o f 2:06. 7. O'Donnell followed 
closely with 2:07. 7.

Smith led again in the 120 
Yard High Hurdles with a time; 
o f  16.1. Seagraves followed 
with 16. 6.

John Lowe Placed second with 
41. 8 in a close race with Tho­
mas, 41. 0, in the 330 Yard In­
termediate Hurdles. Both boys 
broke the old record o f 42. 4 
set by Jerry Hoover o f  Seagra­
ves in 1967.

Greg Jones placed second wi­
th 23. 6 behind Thomas, 23. 4, 
in the 220 Yard Dash.

Coahoma took first in the 
Mile Relay with Seagraves pl­
acing second. Seagraves took 
first in the 440 Yard Dash and 
Tahoka took first in the 100 
Yard Dash and Shot Put events; 
Seagraves took first in High Ju­
mp.

Babe Ruth Team 
M ay  Be Formed

Boys in the age group o f  13- 
15_years old interested in for ­
ming a Babe Ruth League here 
this year are urged to contact 
Cordell Huddleston as soon as 
possible.

Huddleston states that only a 
few days are left for forming a 
team and at least 15 boys are 
needed to form one here.

Plains didn't have a Babe Ru - 
thteam lastyear, but as in past 
years they w ill work with D e ­
nver City, Seagraves and Semi­
nole.

Persons interested are asked 
to call Huddleston at the bank 
or his home, at their conveni­
ence.

BEARDEN,
O ff the Students Get



ASSOCIATION

The Plains Record
And The

Yoakum County Review 
Ray Trent, Publisher

~\  THE PLAINS RECORD. THURSDAY, APRIL 11, 1968, PAGE TWO

SELL« RENT« SWAP« HIRE ♦ BUY» SELL« RENT« SWAP« HIRE • BUY • SELL« RENT« SWAP* HI

© 3 2 ©  C1ASSIFIED AOS GET RESULTS
HIRE • BUY « SELL» RENT • SWAP • HIRE • BUY• SELL« RENT« SWAP • HIRE • BUY • SELL* RENT

Ray Trent, . Editor

Jewell Anderson Purely Local

Margaret Box State Line News
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LOOK TO BOOTS
Healthy growth of living 

plants depends on their nonvisi- 
ble root structures. Plants 
professionally grown and condi­
tioned in traditional red clay 
flower pots, rather than in syn­
thetic containers, guarantef 
root insurance. They offer at­
tractive foliage and flowers anc 
thriving rootballs.

REAL ESTATE

The Plains Record

MISC

PUBLISHED EACH THURSDAY AT PLAINS, TEXAS 79355

Entered as second class matter at the Post Office at Plains, 
Texas under the act o f  Congress, March 3,1879.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES- $4. 00 PER YEAR IN YOAKUM AND 
TERRY COUNTIES. $5. 00 PER YEAR ELSEWHERE.

FOR SALE: The Cawles Compre­
hensive Encyclopedia-'The 
Volume Library". Call 456-8682

P. O. Box 1006 
Phone 456-4116

* * * * * * * * * * * * * $  
*  *

I  S u p p l i e s  I

I
BUSINESSES

I
0

F
C

FOR FAST, RELIABLE OIL FIELD SERVICE, 

CA LL:

Batchelor

Oilfield

Construction

Company 

Fully Insured

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom home, 
living room, large utility, 2 
baths-one bath carpeted, me- 
xican tile entry, paneled ma­
ple finish den and kitchen, 
built in gun rack, built in china 
closet, large fireplace, double 
glass sliding doors open on pa­
tio, house carpeted other than 
kitchen, one bath and utility , 
double car garage, built in ov­
en and range, and a garbage 
disposal, flower beds run with 
concrete, 2 lots, paved street 
and wonderful neighbors. Call 
B. D. McDonnell. 456-4444 
after 5 p .m .,  or by day phone 
456-8080. 103 East 4th.

$19, 000 Cash for house or
$2500 for Eauity.

GO CLASSIFIED

FOR SALE; 1966 Chev. Pickup 
butane system on it-low  m ile­
age, good condiction. Call 
456-9181 or 456-8900.

FOR SALE; 3 bedroom house, 
1 3, 4 bath, den, large living 
room and kitchen, Basement 
(10xl2)under kitchen. Large 
garage and lot. Have to sell 
being transferred. During the 
day call 456-3377 and after 
6 p. m. call 456-4959.

Houses for sale to be moved. 
CHEAP. Phone D. C. Newsom 
Gin. 456-8116.

H E L P-W  A N T E D

WANTED:Young man to work
in John Deere Parts Dept_____
Experience not necessary but 
farm background helpful. Con­
tact Dan Houck, Plains Farm 
Supply.

FOUND: A 1939 Class-ring 
with the initials M. J. G.Can 
be claim ed at Roger Harvey's 
o ffice  in Elementary school bu­
ilding or by calling 456-8490.

LOST: Borrower please return 
four wheel flat bed trailer.
I need i t ! 1 Dick Me Ginty.

1201 East 10th Street Plains, Texas 456-4272

HOUSE FOR SALE: 4 bedroom,
1 3 /4  Bath; Carpeted and Dra­
ped; Fireplace; Patio; Garage; 
Fenced Yard. Phone.456-3434.

Official Ticket Headquarters 
Venta Oficial de Boletos

U e ci
ROY GUETERSLOH

County Commissioner, Precinct 3

M AY 4

RENTALS
HEMISFAIRB8
TEXAnvORLO^Am^ATMNTOmO

FOR RENT 
Com pletely Furnished 

Apartments. See 
A T

THE P LA IN S M O TE L

Funk’s-G
BUY 3 GET 1 FREE ON 755, 
788A, 92F AND 115F.

ANDERSON GRAIN CO. 
AND

GOODPASTURE GRAIN

C hannel 8 Th e  T V  L o a  C h an n e l 10
SATURDAY*__APRIL 13 , 1968 12-30 Sign Off News
8:00A- M. Super 6 «  WEDNESDAY. 'APRIL 17 !, 1968 I!16 CenturY*
8- 30 
9:00
9- 30 
10:00 
10:30 
11:00 
11-30 
12:00 
12:30 
12 55
1:00
4;00
4 ; 30
5 ; 00 
5 ; 30 
5;45

6:00 
6; 30 
7:30 
8:00 
10:00 
10.15 
10:30 
12:00 

/ r-t

SUNDAY*
"9-.00AM
9:15
9:30
10:00

Ü.00
11:30 
12 00 
12:30 
1.00 
1¡15 
3 00 
4:30 
5:w0 
5:30

6:30 
7:30 
8.00 
9:00 
10:00 
10:15 
10:20 
1030

MONDAY*

m
8.00
9:00
10:00
10:15
10:20
10.30
12:00
12130

Super President* 
Flintstone*
Samson & Goliath* 
Birdman*
Atom Ant*
Top Cat*
Cool Me Cool*
King & Odie 
Cartoon Fun 
Words & Music 
Baseball
N. M. Outdoors 
Travelog
S hirtsleeve Session 
Church o f  Christ 
Social Security

Frank McGee Report* 
The Saint*
Get Smart*
Sat. night Movie-1 
Saturday Edition"
N. M. M. L
Sat. Tonight Show*
Channel 8 Presents-*

ute

APRIL 14 . 1968
Light Time 
Scared Heart 
Homestead USA* 
Easter Service

Insight
This Is The Life 
Meet The Press*
NBC Religious Series* 
TBA 

Mqvie
War ThU Week
Frank McGee Report* 
G. E College Bowl* 

"Going To Bethlehem "

Walt Disney* 
Mothers-in-Law* 
Bonanza •
High Chaparral*
First National News
Weather
Sports
Classica Theatre-

The Monkees* 
Rowan & Martin 
Movin' witn Nancy 
I Spy •
Ch. 8 News* 
Weather*
Sports
Tonight Show* 
Californians 

Sign pff News 
TUESDAY, ? A PRILLS!. 1968 
6:30 I Dream’ Of Jeannie*
7 .0 0  Jerry Lewis Show *
gjoo Tues. Night Movie-

6:30 The Virginian* 
8:00 Special 
9:68 Run For Your Life* 
lo;00 Ch. 8 News*
10:10 Weather 
10:20 Sports 
10:30 Tonight Show* 
12:00 Kit Carson 
12:30 Sign Off News 
THURSDAY. 1A PRIL 181.1968
6:30 The Enormus Egg*
7:30 Ironsides*
8:30 Dragnet*
9:00 Dean Martin Show*
10:00 Ch. 8 News
10:10 Weather
10:20 Sports
10:30 Tonight Show
12:00 The Medics
12:30 Sign Off News
FRIDAY. A PRIL 19 ± 1968
'6:30 Tarzan*

7-30 Star Track*
8:30 Hollywood Squares
9-00 "Tomorrow’s World"
10:00 Ch. 8 News
10:10 Weather
10:20 Sports
10:30 Tonight Show*
12:00 Panic
12:30 Sign Off News

10-00 Channel S News 
10:10 Weather
lO:20 Sports
10;30 Tonight Show*
12:00 Kit Carson

CHANNEL 10

SATURDAY, APRIL 13 
8:00 Frankenstein, Jr*
8:30 The Herculiods*
9:00 Shazzan •
9:30 Space Ghost*
10:00 Moby Dick/Mightor* 
10:30 Superman/Aquaman* 
11:30 Johnny Quest*

12;00 Hockey
2;30 Movie
3;30 Big Picture
4:00 G olf
5:00 The Rifleman 
5-.30 Lone Star Sportsman 
b-uu LB6 tvening News/ 

Roger Mudd 
6:30 Lost in Space*
7:30 My Three Sons*
8:00 Hogan's Heroes*
8:30 Petticoat Junction* 
9:00 Mannix*
10:00 Wild, Wild West* 
11:00 NWS 
11:30 Movie:

SUNDAY. 1 APRIL 14)

9;00 Believing 
10;00 Easter Service
11;00 Faith Today
11:30 Face the Nation 
12;00 Fkttem for Living 
12;30 Peace 
1; 0 0 Movie
2;00 G olf 
3; 00 Golf
4-30 Amateur Hour*

The Plains Record

5:00 The 21st Century*
5:30 The Rifleman 
6:00 Lassie*
6:30 Gentle Ben*
7:00 Ed Sullivarf 
8:00 Smothers Brothers*
9:00 Mission Impossible*
10:00 Laredo*
11:30 CBS Sunday News*
11:45 Cimarron Strip*

MONDAY. APRIL 15.
7:30 The Lucy Show*

8:00 The Andy Griitlth Show* 
8:30 Family Affair*
9:00 The Carol Burnett Show* 
10:00 Gunsmoke*
11:00 NWS 
11:130 Movie;

TUESDAY, ¡APRIL 16 
7:30 Red Skelton Show*
8:30 Good Morning World* 
9:00 Special
10:00 Jackie Gleason Show* 
11:00 NWS 
11:30 Movie;

WEDNESDAY. A PRIL 1 7 _  
7:30 Beverly Hillbillies* 
8:00 Green Acres*
8:30 He and She*
9:00 Johathan Winters* 
10;00 (\iter Limits

11:00 NWS 
11:30 Movie:

THURSDAY, 1APRIL181 
7:30 F-Troop*
8:00 Movie:

10:U0 Perry Mason 
11:00 NWS 
11:30 Movie

FRIDAY, ¡APRIL 19 
7:30 Gomer Pyle* 
8:00 Movie;

10:00 Bingo 
10:30 Ripcord*
11:00 NWS 
11:30 Movie;

y o u r ¡  independent ] 
. Insurance g  /agent

SURVIS YOU FIRST

JESTER GRAHAM 
AGENT

PHONE; 456-3595

Help when nia ins
yOU Insurance

need it most A ®ency

M i l
"C lu ì^ Ì

BABY-SITTER; Will babysit in 
my home. Mrs. A. B. Huddl­
eston, 204 East Second. Phone 
456-4455.

Correct Answer is:

yokel

DIRECT MATTRESS CO.

Mattress rebuilt, innerspring, 
$14. 90; Cotton, $9. 90. Also 
new innersprings, orthopedics, 
foam rubber and king size.
Call THE FIX-IT SHOP a t 
456-2955, who is receiving 
calls for our company locat­
ed at 1613 Ave. H. Lubbock.

Need responsible party in 
Plains area to take over pay­
ments on 1967 model Singer 
sewing machine. Automatic 
zig-zagger, blind hems, fan­
cy patterns, buttonholes, etc. 
Four payments at $6. 76 or dis­
count for cash. Write Credit 
Department, 1114 19th Street, 
Lubbock, Texas.

BUILDING 
ELECTRICAL 
PLUMBING 
FARM
HOUSEHOLD
RANCH
OLD MASTERS
REFINISHING
pittsburg
PITTSBURG PAINTS

COGBURN-YOUNG 
HARDWARE 

"TRUE VALUE STORE"

!
♦
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FOR SALE

Windmill Supplies 
Plastic & Steel Pipe 
Plumbing Bolts 
Hand Tools 
Gifts
Ammunition 
Automatic Washers 
and Dryers 
Sherman Williams 

Paint

DR. WILLIAM R. GRUBBS

OPTOMETRIST'

DENVER CITY, TEXAS 
315 N . MAIN 

Phone 592-3345 
Mon., Tue., Thur. & Fri.

WOODY'b
h a r d w a r e

AND OIL CO,

*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
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*
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*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
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FAMILY 
NOTEBOOK
BY MARY TROY 

Homemaking Consultant 
Jones & Laughlin Steel Corp.I

NOTICE
Please note that our new 
deadline for submitting 
your news items to the 
paper is Tuesday-noon! 

THANKS

A DAY FOR REJOICING

d?l City politiceli
~ Support !

ONCE UPON A MATTRESS I

THF/ SAy AAARPIED AAEhJ 
UVE LON6Ei?-eur 
SIN6WE KEN U\/E 
\T UP LONÖEI2.'

Easter Brunts
London Buns

1 egg
/ 2 cup milk 
Yu cup sugar
2 cups New Bisquick
2 tablespoons salad oil or 

melted butter 
1 cup currants or raisins 
Z2 cup candied fruit (3 ounces)
Heat oven to 400°. Grease 16 
medium or 20 small muffin 
cups or use paper baking cups. 
B l e n d  all ingredients; beat 
vigorously %  minute. Fill pre­
pared muffin oups %  full. Bake 
12 to 15 minutes or until golden 
brown. Serve hot. Makes 16 
medium or 20 small muffins. 
Just for fun, serve these London 
Buns i n s i d e  a gay Easter 
basket. Then pass the butter. 
(Jam’s not necessary, but only 
you know your family’s tastes.)

King Louis the Fourteenth of « 
France had 413 beds. Today most | 
of us have just one and we don’t » 
always buy that one with the f 
care and attention we should. 1 
Since the average person sleeps f 
about one-third of his life away, 
a good mattress is a “must.”

I Here is a short guide to mattress 
'/'buying:

1. Shop at a reputable store.
1 2. Buy the best you can —

it will cost less In the long 
run. A “bargain” mattress 
can cost you rest as well 
as the price of a premature 
replacement.

3. Test several mattresses by 
stretching out on them.

4. Make sure the ticking is 
closely woven, the borders 
and edges r e i n f o r c e d  
against sagging.

5. Read the label to see what’s 
inside the mattress. The 
best in bedding is a quality 
mattress constructed with 
steel innerspring coils and 
a box spring of equal qual­
ity to go with it.

Once you’ve purchased your 
mattress, resolve to keep it In 
good shape, by following these 
simple steps:

1. At the same time you buy 
your mattress, buy a cover 
for it and a washable mat­
tress pad as well.

2. Turn the mattress every 
month or so, side to side 
and end to end.

3. Vacuum or brush mattress 
and box spring o n c e  a 
month.

4. Each linen-changing time, 
open the windows and give 
the mattress — and pillows 
— a fresh-airing.

These few minutes of care' 
will mean maximum comfort and 
wear from your new mattress.

MEETINGS 
AT ALMA'S

1st & 3rd Weeks 
Directors Meet 
2nd & 4th Weeks 
Regular

Chamber 
of

L JC o m n ig i^ j
FOR SALE;By owner, 1956 - 
Chevy-new tire and new bat­
tery only $125. 00. Write Box 
1006, %The Plains Record, in 
Plains, Texas.

The follow ing candidates ha - 
ve authorized the Plains Reccrd 
to announce their candadicies 
for city council position in the 
April 6,1968, special municip­
al election for a city council­
man:

MAYOR:
■Roy Edwards

COUNCILMAN: 
'Doyle Newsom 
Darrell Lindsey’
T. J. Beardon 
T. J. Miller

CITY MARSHALL 
Burton L. Tingle 
Gene Schoenrock..

Cmt,lraS Coral j
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *  *>* * * * * * * * *

Student Council members Charlene Gayle, Jerry Heald and1 
Rodney Trout went with their sponser Mr. Graham to the Stu­
dent Council Convention in San Antonio last week. They sp­
ent Saturday at the FSmisfair. After causing the destruction 
o f  a m ini-m obile train, they proceded to Abilene to invade 
the campus o f  Hardin-Simmons College. They arrived hom e 
Sunday at 6:00 in the evining.

The Regional Track Meet was held at Coahoma last Friday. 
Plains won on second and third places. Some people may 
think this bad, but after all "it's not how you play just as long 
as you win! " Sure it is!

_  Six Weeks Tests wore out the majority o f  the students last 
week. Few had strength enough togfoto the U. I  L Literary 
Meet at Coahoma Saturday. Plains won the events on points. 
However, golf, tennis, and the One Act Play remain to be 
won— we hope.

Tennis suffered Tuesday because o f  weather. The District 
met was held at Plains, mostly indoors. It always rains on 
track meets and tennis meets. The track meets have suffer­
ed and now it's the tennis meets turn.

One Act Plays are scheduled for Thursday here in our aud­
itorium. They begin at 1:30. Of course, we all know who's 
going to win- don't we?

The Plains Cowgirls are playing for Bi-District at Tahoka 
Tuesday night. They play Aspermont. Seems Aspermont 
wants to win State this year--in  everything! P. H. S. 's own 
personal witch put a double evil whammy on Aspermont.
Not that the Cowgirls need the help.

Easter holidays begin Friday at 2:30. We com e back on Ap 
ril 22, i f  anyone remembers to return. Ah! how much fun 
everyone will have with an empty school. Hint to the pol­
ic e ; When school turns out for Easter, be on the lookout for 
a green pickup containing one school principal.

IN THE HALLS OF P. H. S.
Who is the mysterious creature slinking through the dark 

halls o f  P. a  S. 7--------- Mrs. Rushing! ? ! !
Okay, who’ s the nut who told Mr. Aikins, "Here comes 

the judge! ’’? He left town so fast the highway’s still burn­
ing.

County Attorney
VERNOM TOWNES

County Sheriff

OL AN 
JOE

HEATIi
DEATON

* County Tax Assessor-Collector

ROSS IRRIGATION
now has

TRI-MATIC

E . W .  "E L V IS “  CRAIG 
RAY TRENT

County Commissioner

PRECINCT 1 :

VANCE
CHAS.
DEWEY

BROWN
N . FREEMA» 
MCDANIEL

PRECINCT 3 :

RAYMOND BOOKOUT 
TOM WARREN 
POLLY RUSHING 
ROY GUETERSLOH 
ROYCE TROUT 
BARRON BLAIR 
IRA TIDWELL

»•. ï ♦
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South Plains 
Offers Course

Mrs. Tommy Oehrlein will 
instruct a cource in Home Ma­
nagement at South Plains Col­
lege beginning April 23.

This is a non-credit short 
course designed for every ho­
memaker. It is a study o f  ho­
usehold finance, meal planning 
and food buying, kitchen pla­
nning, simplification o f  house­
hold equipment.

In short, this is a plan to get 
the most from every dollar 
earned and to make every mo­
ment o f  a home maker's time 
count.

Classes will be held each Tu­
esday from &:
esday from 7:30 to 9:30 p. m. 
for a period o f six weeks.

T t^ k s t  o f the course isSlO. 
R e^l^rtion  may be made at 
the first class session.

For additional information, 
contact Director o f  Special Se­
rvices, Charles Hays at the 
co i lege.

We wish to express our deeri- 
cst .appreciation for your pra­
yers, cards, letters, flowers and 
words o f  encouragement during 
my recent stay in the hospital.

\lr. and Mrs. Neil Parks.

Peace Corps 
Giving Tests
Plains area residents intere­

sted in putting their skills to 
use in developing nations aro­
und the world are invited to 
take the Peace Corps Placem­
ent Test at 1:30 p. m. on Sat­
urday, April 20 at Lubbock , 
Texas, Room 16A o f  the Post 
Office Building.

The Peace Corps uses the Pl­
acement Test to determine 
how an applicant can best be 
utilized overseas. The test me­
asures general aptitude and the 
ability to learn a language, not 
education or acheivement.The 
test requires no preparation 
and is non-com petitive; and 
an applicant can neither pass 
nor fail.

Persons interested in serving 
with the Peace Corps must fill 
out an application, if  they have 
not already done so, and prese­
nt it to the tester before the te­
at. Application forms are ava­
ilable from post offices or from 
the Peace Corps in Washington, 
D. C. 20525

Twelve thousand Volunteers 
are currently serving in Asia, 
Africa, Latin America and the 
Pacific Island, working with 
the people o f  those nations in 
self-help  projects ranging from 
agriculture and nutrition to au­
to mechanics, education and 
health. Many Volunteers are 
needed for programs which will 
begin this spring and summer.

LEARNING
TAKiSGEEING

M ake School 

Days Happy

Your child's educa­
tion depends upon 
his vision. Arrange to 
have his eyes exam­
ined, glasses fitted, 
periodically.

County Home 
Demonstration 
Held Meeting

The Yoakum County Home 
Demonstration Council met on 
April 2 in the Plains Club Ro - 
om with Mrs. Lee Roy Box pr­
esiding.

After the regular business se­
ssion, Mrs. Joe H. Thompson, 
gave a review o f  parlimentary 
procedure. A total o f  13 were 
presented for the meeting.

Thirteen county club women 
and Judge Gene Bennett atten­
ded the District II Convention 
at Tulia March 27. Yoakum 
County has asked for the 1969 
Convention to be held in Den­
ver City.

TEXAS CRUDE OIL PRODUCTION

Barrels Per Day

I 0 1.001 5.000

Xf:- Under 100 | J |  5,00110.000

}!;;;! 10U 000 H I 10.00125.000
■  Over 25,000

Tetos Mid Confinent 
Oil & Gas Association

Texas crude oil production, jections based on a study by 
recorded for the past 73 years, Texas Mid-Continent Oil and 
surpassed the 30 -billion-barrel Gas Association, 
mark in 1967, according to pro- Thestate’s crude total to Ja­

nuary 1,1967, was 29. 46 b illi­
on barrels, and the state ann­
ual production in recent years 
has averaged a billion barrels 
or better.

With 199 o f Te'xas’ 25£ cou­
nties producing crude oil, inc­
ome averaging about $3. 4 b i­
llion a year is distributed wi­
dely over the state, making oil 
production an important part 
o f  the com m ercial scene. 
Yoakum County, which has 
had recorded production since 
1936, has had a total crude oil 
output o f 465, 348, 926 barrels 
up to the beginning o f 1967. 
Yoakum County production in 
1966was 19, 724, 726 barrels at 
the rate o f  54, 040 barrels a 
day.

Thestatehas 36 counties wh­
ich produced at the rate o f  25, 
ooo barrels or more per day. 
The three largest are; Andrew^ 
215, 000 barrels per day; Ector, 
175, 305 barrels per day; and 
Crane, 130, 000 barrels per day. 
Gregg County, which still pro­
duces 75, 000 barrels per day, 
is the only county to have pr­
oduced more than two billion- 
barrels o f  qil.

R E - E L E C T

DU H M
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continuing program, to seek out 
the disables who are doing 
without services and see that 
they receivenhe services they 
need. As Easter Seal Represe­
ntative, Mr. Loyd is the person 
to contact for services from the 
Easter Seal Society.

The Texas Easter Seal Soci^ 
ety helps support 21 treatment 
facilities in, Texas where cri - 
ppled children and adults are 
treated regardless o f  their'abi­
lity to pay. Physical, occupat- 
tional and speech therapy, are 
offered to help the handicapp­
ed overcom e their disabilities.
A completereferralprogram to 
ensure equal rehibilitation se­
rvices to every person in T ex­
as is included in Easter . Seal 
Society services, he added.

Mr. Loyd asked that everyo- • 
ne in need o f  services consac't 
him at Plains State Bank in Pl­
ains, Texas 79355., 
r He added that the Easter Se­
al Appeal w ill close Sunday, 
April 14, and full support sh­
ould be given the’ Easter-.Sèal. 
Society by every citizen o fY o - 
akum. County..

Easter Seal 
Society Gives 
Last Appeal

A last minute appeal for su­
pport o f the Easter Seal Soci­
ety for Crippled Children and 
Adults and its program o f  serr 
vices to the handicapped was 
issued today by Mr. B. E. Loyd, 
who is the Easter Seal Repres­
entative in Yoakum County.

The Easter Seal provided tr­
eatment and services for the 
17, 622 physically handicapped 
children and adults in Texas ' 
last year, Mr. Loyd said, and 
this program needs to be exp­
anded. Many people are going 
withoutservices that would in­
crease the productiveness o f 
their lives and make them 'ha­
ppier. With increased growth 
ofthe Easter Seal Society, m o­
re and more o f  these people 
will be reached, he added.

The Society is carrying on a

M a k e  Y o u r  V o t e  C o u n t

VOTE FOR
I

DAY ATTENDANTS: Serving patients during the day at the 
Plains Nursing Home are Margie Vidales, maid, Mrs. W anda 
Dye, aide, Mrs. Janice Cordova, aide, Mrs. Cleo Powell,LVN 
and Mrs. Velma Callis, cook.

m  m ît
CANDIDATE FOR

COUNTY TAX ASSES£0R-C0LLECT0a

The Spanish Mission held the 
services Sunday at the Nursing 
Home. Each one received a bl­
essing from the wonderful serv­
ice.

We have three new guest at 
the home. They are Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Fisher, from Loving- 
ton, N. M. ; Mr. Lee McDay , 
from Big Springs, Texas, and 
Mrs. Lowe's soiVin-laws, Mr.

Sadler from Vedar, Texas is sp­
ending theweek with her. Mrs. 
Lowe, Mr. Sadler and Mrs. Cleo 
Powell made a business trip to 
Big Springs Monday.
Mrs. Cleo Powell spent three 
days in Las Cruces over- the 
weekend visiting with her da - 
ughter ans son - in -law , M r. 
and Mrs. Billy Buzbee and fa­
mily.

FOR FAIR AND 
FOR ONE WHO

IMPARTIAL COUNTYr_WIDE GOVERNMENT. 
WILL TRY HARDER.,

• ••••• •••••••••••©••••••• 99 • • • •••••• • • • • 0^ • • • • • flyS •••••*

iSudie ^ . U e m p ó O H

CHDA Says...

YOAKUM COUNTY SHERIFF
Pd. Pol. Ad. By Olan Heath

Planning meals and doing sh­
opping ahead o f the Easter we­
ekend will help avoid the last 
minute and make it easier for 
homemakers to serve appetiz­
ing, colorful and nutritious , 
meals. Foods do play an im po­
rtant part in the observance o f 
Easter.

A suggested menu that was 
given by Gwendolyne Cylatt, 
Extension Consumer Marketing 
Specalist is:

MENU
Chilled Tomato Juice Cocktail 
Baked Ham with Cherry or Or­
ange Marmalade G laze.Scoll- 
oped Potatoes, Buttered Peas, 
Gelatin Vegetable Salad a La

Unprecedented ! Happening 
now at your Chevrolet dealers, 
an explosion o f extra 

buying power.

Only the leader could do it!

• * 'X * v * )

tß'

You've never seen savings like this 
on 68 Chevrolets and Chevelles. 
You save on America s most popu­
lar V8s with automatic transmissions. 
Check these Bonus Savings Plans. 
1. Any Chevrolet or Chevelle with 
200-hp Turbo-Fire V8, Powerglide 
and whitewalls.

2 . Any Chevrolet or Chevelle with 
250-hp Turbo-Fire V8, Powerglide 
and whitewalls.
3 . Any regular Chevrolet with 250- 
hp Turbo-Fire V8, Turbo Hydia- 
Matic and whitewalls.
4 . Now, for the first time ever, big 
savings on power disc brakes and

mpala Convertib le

power steering when you buy any 
Chevrolet or Chevelle with V8 
engine.
5 .  Buy any Chevrolet or Chevelle 
V8 2-door or 4-door hardtop model 
—save on vinyl top, electric clock, 
wheel covers and appearance guard 
items.

42 6863

GM

Easter Egg, Garlic Buttered Fr­
ench Bread, Relish Tray, Easter 
Decorated Cake, Beverage.

Easter is not Easter vithout 
Easter eggs for the youngsters. 
So when coloring the eggs use 
the white shells to get a clear 
bright color. Brown and specked 
shells are best suited for use wi­
th decales, transfers, and for de­
corating with crayons, pencils , 
or paint brush.

The shells take color when 
the eggs are still warm or hot. 
Dyes which are sold must bear 
the words "Inspected and app­
roved by the Food and Drug 
Administration.

Two methods are recom m en­
ded for hard cooking eggs says 
Dr. F. A. Gardner, Associate Pr­
ofessor in Poultry Science. Co­
ld water method:Cover eggs in 
pan with enough water to com e 
at least 1 inch above the eggs. 
Bring rapidly to boiling. Turn 
o ff heat and i f  necessary set 
pan o ff unit to prevent further 
boiling. Cover and let stand in 
hot water for 15 minutes. Cool 
immediately and throughly in
cold water-------- this makes the
shells easier to remove and he­
lps to prevent dark surface on 
yolks.

Boiling Water method:Place 
cold eggs in a dish o f  lukewa­
rm water to prevent cracking 
the shells. Bring water in a pan 
to rapid boiling, using enough 
water to com e 1 inch above the 
eggs. Transfer eggs from warm 
water to boiling water with sp- 
oon;Reduce heat to keep water 
below simmering and hold for 
20 minutes. Cool eggs prompt­
ly and throughly in cold water.

If eggs are to be colored this 
should be done before cooling 
Vegetable dyes are safe to use.

Q u a l i f i e d -  T r u s t w o r t h y .

D e d i c a t e d -  D e p e n d a b l e -

MAY 4
THIS AD PAID FOR BY

RAY TRENT
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NEW! For clean Sorghum... 
spray weeds when you see them!

with BANVEL
Mrs. Geo. Beggs o f  Pep, N. M  

and Mrs. Fred Alleson o f Port- 
ales, N. M. visited Marie Gris­
ham Monday.

W illie Sisco o f  Portales, N. M  
visited In the John Anderson 
¡home Monday night.

Mrs. D. H. Kirby visited Mrs. 
G. C. Jinkins in the Methodist 
Hospital Monday.

Mrs. H. D. McDonnell is a 
patient in the Brownfield Hos­
pital.

The Dub Newsom's o f  Lubb­
ock visited Mr. and Mrs. D. C. 
Newsons Monday night.

Mrs. Joe Curry was shopping 
in Lubbock Monday.

TennieM axieof . Odessa sp­
ent Monday with Mrs. W. L. , 
McClellan.

WHITTENBURG
U N D E R S T A N D S . . .  

E LEC T H IM  
G O V E R N O R

Pd Pol. Adv . Texans for W hittenburg.
Robert Mahone. Chr. I

Velsicol announces Banvel herbicide for con­
trol of all hard-to-kl 11 weeds of major Impor­
tance In gra in  sorghum . This Includes 
carelessweed (pigweed), sunflower, lambs- 
quarter, purslane, morning glory and other 
annual broadleaf weeds. Banvel herbicide Is 
applied post-emergence, so there are no 
wasted sprays In years when rain is scarce 
and weeds are not a problem. With Banvel 
you see your weed problem and then spray- 
all in plenty of time to give young sorghum 
plants plenty of opportunity to grow.

Banvel is sprayed onto weed leaves and 
translocates to the roots... for new, total con­
trol of weeds. Just apply Banvel between the 
10th and 25th day after emergence of grain 
sorghum (approximately 4 to 12 inches tall).

■ Banvel is not dependent on soil moisture 
for its effectiveness, so its, results are depend­
able. And it’s a liquid 'that won’t clog your 
sprayers; nor does Banvel need constant 
agitation.

Banvel increases yields. It’s excellent for 
use on grain sorghum, vvheat, barley, oats and 
field corn. Order Banvel herbicide to get full 
potential from your valuable, high-yielding 
sorghum seed.
See your v e l s i c o l
dealer today.
You’ll be 
glad you did!

B A N V E L *
H E R B I C I D E

VELSICOL CHEMICAL CORPORATION
341 E. Ohio Street • Chicago, Illinois 60611

© VELSICOL  CHEMICAL  CORPORATION.  19fi8 o
TH E  G R O W IN G  W O R LD  OF

Prosper w ith  pesticides by using them  safely! Follow label d irections.

VC-9780—1051B
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Tsa Mo Ca 
In Club Meet

The Tsa Mo Ga Study Club 
met in regular session April 8, 
1968 in the clubhouse at 8 p. m. 
with president Mrs. A lf Carpe­
nter presiding.

Eighteen members answered 
roll call with "Wh at is our re­
sponsibility to our youth living 
in a changing w orld?”

Mrs. Dickie Green was dire­
ctor for the program on Home 
Life.

Mrs. J. M. Tippett gave a ve­
ry intertaining review o f  the 
book’Through Darkest Adole- 
scense" by Richard Armour.

It is Richard Armours som e­
what com ical contention (and 
who are we to disagree with 
him?) thatadolescence is a di­
sease and no wonder drug or 
vaccine has yet been discove­
red to cure it. A Nobel Prize 
might some day be won by so­
me scientist for a sure cure, 
though there might be some 
dispute over wheather the pri­
ze  should be for medicine or 
peace.

In his twenty-fourth book, 
satirist Armour does a white 
smock and views adolesence 
clin ically . If he holds a small 
hammer in his hand it is for 
protection, not to test reflexes. 
He speaks, he declares, from 
experiencesince he is the fat­
her o f  two teenagers and con­
fesses to having been a teena­
ger himself once------ only once.
He writes with shrewd madness 
a bout such fundamentals as the 
bathroom, the telephone, teeth 
straightening, acne,homework, 
parties, chaperones, care, a mo- 
king, drinking, the strange dia­
lect known as "Teenese" and 
goingsteady.In fact he covers,- 
or uncovers just about everyt­
hing printable a bout young pe­
ople.

Having made a shambles o f 
histroy (It all started with Co­
lumbus), literature ( Twisted 
Tale from Shakespeare, e t c .), 
golf (G olf is a four-letter wo­
rd) and medicine(The M edici- 
al Muse or what to do 'til the 
Patient C om es.) Richard Arm­
our now takes teenagers apart 
and puts them together again, 
w ithonlva few parts left over.

Mr. Armour is a college  pr­
ofessor who graduates form Pa-

mt. ana Mrs. Robert Yeagers 
o f  Brownfield visited her pare- 
nts Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Crutch­
er Sunday afternoon.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Bill Al­
exander and boys Friday night 
was her mother, Mrs. E .LRe 
ams o f Ralls.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Ray Jo­
nes was Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Jo­
nes o f  Brownfield. They also 
visited the Hugh Snodgrass' a- 
while Sunday afternoon.

Greg Jones and Dan Fields 
went to look over the college 
at E. N.M. U. Saturday and re ­
turned home Sunday.

Greg Jones was presented the 
football Fighting Heart Award 
at the Plains School Athletic 
Banquet. Gregg is a senior and 
the aw ard is aw arded each ye­
ar to a senior boy who is voted 
to work the hardest for their 
team.

Carter Snodgrass, a student at 
Texas Tech, visited his parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Snodgrass , 
over the weekend.

Sunday guest o f the Truett. 
Jones' were Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Jones o f  Lamesa and Mrs. Bob 
Green and daughter o f Phoenix

,Vlr. and Mrs. Alton Elmore , 
were Sunday dinner guest of 
Mr. and Mrs. Avon Brantley of 
Plains.

Mr. and Mrs. Reg Martin were 
supper guest o f  Mr. and Mrs. T. 
Sterling o f West Point Saturday,

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Reg Ma­
rtin and family Saturday was 
Mr. and Mrs. Sidney Hart and 
Serena o f Saigon.

The Homer Sudderth's and 
Mrs. Dick Cook and family vi­
sited Dick Cook in Carlsbad 
over the w eekend. Mrs. Marsh­
all had surgery last week. She 
is reported doing fine.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Huff and 
family were honored with a 
going away party Monday nig­
ht at the Tokio School House. 
They are moving to Dalhart.
. Mrs. Fred Lowrey took her fa 
ther, A. B. Huddleston, to Lu­
bbock Friday to the Methodist 
Hospital to ha ve some test made

Mr. and Mrs. A. K. Gilliam 
spentseveral days last week at

their cabin in Ruidoso, N. M.
Visiting the A. K. Gilliam's 

over the weekend was their gr­
andchildren, Kie and Jenniefer 
Gilliam. The Alvin Paul's sp­
ent Saturday and Sunday v is i­
ting them.

Mrs. Rowe Stephens and fa - 
mily, Mrs. John Curits and fa­
mily, and Mrs. L L. Smith vi­
sited their aunt and sister fam­
ily at Slaton Thursday.

Mrs. Rowe Stephens attended 
the Tel-A -Lady Club meeting 
in Brownfield Monday night.

Mr. and Mrs. R. Stephens and 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Elmore 
was in Lubbock Sunday to see 
the show 'T he Graduate. "

Mrs. Carl Lowrey, Mrs. Roy 
Lowrey and Mrs. W. L. Steph­
ens o f Brownfield attended the 
Cottton Council meeting in Lu­
bbock Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Elmo­
re, were Sunday dinner guest 
o f  Mr. and Mrs. Alton Elmore 

Mr. and Mrs. Truett Jones and 
family visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Glen Jones at Lamesa 
Sunday. His sister Mrs. Bob Gr­
een and Patrica o f  Phoenix, 
Arizonia also were guest there.

Visiting the Dee Sink's fThu- 
rsday-Sunday was Mr. and Mrs. 
S. D. HaughtofFt.Worth. Also 
visiting were the Jerry Sink's 
o f  Tulia.

Joyce Bearden, Sue Waters , 
Juanice Bell, Bertie Bagwell, 
Winnie Harrell, Hershey Knig­
ht and Bro. Don Knight atten­
ded a V. B. S. clin ic at Brow - 
nfield all day Monday.

Guest o f  Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Yeatts Friday night were Mr. 
and Mrs. Lewis Waters and Bro. 
and Mrs. Don Knight. They 
played 84.

Mines. Lewis Waters, Ray Be­
arden, C. C. Perkins and Bro. 
and Mrs. Don Knight visited 
Mrs. Eddie Earnest and new ba­
by in West Texas Hospital Wed­
nesday.

The Ray Bearden's visited 
Mr. andMrs. Eddie Earnest and 
baby Sunday and went on to 
Denver City to visit Mr.and 
Mrs. Rubin Bearden and Mr. 
and Mrs. James Bearden.

Mr. and Mrs. Bennie Green 
o f  Lubbock visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Bearden Thursday night.

. ■ *' • ' ~ " V  *

mona L.onege,.took a Ph. D. at 
Harvard and is now Balch Lec­
turer in English Literature at 
Scupps College in California. 
In addition to numerous books, 
he has written light verse and 
even lighter prose for over a 
hundred magazines in the U. S. 
and England.

Through Darkest Adolescen­
ce  is a book to be loved, lau­
ghed over, and learned from 
Mrs. Tippett said the test o f  a 
good reviews was to make the 
listeners want to read the book. 
This she accomplished, and the 
book can be found in our local 
library.

Mrs. Grace Clinten gave the 
scripture reading.

Mrs. R. K. Field and Mrs. Gr­
ace Clinton were hostesses for 
the social hour.

last week with Mr. and Mrs. 
Russell Faulkenberry.

Ray Strickland went to Leve- 
lland Friday and took his dad 
to Methodist Hospital in Lubb­
ock for some test.

By Margaret Bo* V

Billy Spencer is home from 
the hospital. He had underwe­
nt surgery for a broken collar 
bone and is doing fine.

Orville Izzard and George f  f 
Lubbock were dinner gueat Mo­
nday in thehome of Adell and 
Robert Box.

Visitors in the home of the 
Tom Box's Sunday were the 
Randall Hughs', the Ronnie
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Davis' ot Welch, the Glen Hu­
ghes' of Seminole, Mrs. Grace 
Hughes', Phyllis Kreig and the 
Lee Roy Box's.
. Terry Bacon attended the Gi- 
iners Convention in Dallas la­
st weekrepresenting the Bronco 
Farmer's Co-op Gin.

The Tex Belcher's moved to 
Dora, N. M. last week.

The Travis Jones' visited fr­
iends and relatives last week 
in Midwest City, Oklahoma.

Sat. night will be Gladiola 
Youth Center meeting at 8 
p.m,; Each family is invited 
to attend and bring a salad and 
play games. Barbecue plans 
are to be made for June. Come 
and enjoy a visit with your ne­
ighbor

The Tom Box's went to Mu- 
nday, Texas Saturday to attend 
the funeral of Oates Golden. 
He was buried in Goree.

Hour
Readers: Roger Looney, Roy 

Taylor, Venesa Ellis and Kar­
en Houck.

Listeners: LaTricia Edwards, 
Gena Neal, Julia Fitzgerald , 
Janeth Sudderth. Sandro Barnes,

Mark Madden, Steve Randall, 
Curt Randall, Gary Culw ell, 
Becky Massey, Billy Skinner , 
Michael Houck, Chris Barron, 
Teddy Willis, DanRedwine, 
Rhonda Teaff, Matt Barron, 
Johna Gail Fitzgerald, Penci 
Me Rae, Robbie Blount, Liz 
Chandler, Daune Schoenrock, 
Janet Graham,Shaun Barnett, 
Berry Raley, Shannon Raley, 
Suzann Cross and Tye Houck.

^ * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *  * * * * * ^
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■By Mw»U Andenon \ \
Mrs. Robert Chambles recie- 

ved a bad cut on the foot last 
week, which took 14 stitches 
to close.
' Mr. and Mrs. Kieth Green and 
children of Turkey, Texas spe­
nt the weekend with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Ch­
ambles.

Mrs. Russell Faulkenberry is 
reported some better. She was 
moved from Yoakum Cojlos- 
pital Friday to Methodist in 
Lubbock. Her daughter, Mrs. 
James Anderson of Odessa sp­
ent the weekend with her.

James Anderson and children 
of Odessa visited his parents 
over the weekend, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Anderson.

Debbie Anderson of Odessa 
spent Sunday night with her 
cousin, Latrica Edwards.

Mrs. Leroy Neal and children 
AnnConnard, Marie and Hel­
en Grisham went to Odessa Sat­
urday. They spent the night 
with Mr. and Mrs. Alton Ste­
wart in Goldsmith.

Mrs. W. L McClellan and Mrs 
John Anderson spent last Wed. 
with Mrs. McClellan's broth­
er and wife, Mr. and Mrs. C. 
L. Strickland in Levelland.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayland Pow­
ell and children of Midland 
spent the weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Slim Ra- 
ndwll.

Mr. and Mrs. L Bookout vi­
sited Ruth O’Neal and Jim O’ 
Neal and family in Bronco.

Mr. and Mrs. Leo White visi­
ted Mr. arid Mrs. Donnie Sha fer 
in Shallowater last Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Slim Smith at­
tended the track meet in Coa­
homa Friday, then spent the 
night with his brother in Snyd­
er and returned homeSaturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Hughdean 
of Bearford, S. D. spent part of

mEvi
m
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Treat the Family This Easter 
Visit Us for a Tasty Dinner!

Try Our Specials Too

A ll  You C an E a t  
$1.0011!

Fish
P l a t e

T H U R S D A Y  N I G H T

F r i e d  Ch i cke n
F R ID A Y  N IG H T

I Alma’s Restaurant l
»p rp ^  ^  *4* *T* *4* •j' *X* rj* »4» rj* »f» rj» «H

(Dit a*(till }ar away stood oh old 

rugged cross, ^ (t e  emblem ó%

sulle riusi aktd sitarne "

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
James J. Futch, pastor 
Sunday SchooL . .  9:45 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  11:00 a. m. 
Evening Worship.. .  6:30 a.
Evening Worship.. .  6:30 p. m. 
Wednesday Choir Practice.. .  7:30 p. m.

PLAINS MISSION BAUTISTA NUEVA VIDA 
Frank Ramos, pastor 
Sunday SchooL . .  10:00 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  11:30 a. rri.
Training Union.. .  7:00 p. m.
Evening Worship.. .  7:45 p. m.
Wednesday Prayer Meeting.. .  7:00 p. m.

TOKIO MEXICAN BAPTIST MISSION 
Sunday School.. .  10:00 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  11:00 a. m.
Evening Worship.. .  7:00 p. m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting.. .  7:30 p. m.

STATE LINE BAPTIST, BRONCO 
Jesse F. Allen, pastor 
Sunday School.. .  10:00 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  11:00 a. m.
Training Union.. .  6:30 p. m.
Evening Worship.. .  7:30 p. m.
W. M U. Tuesday.. .  3; 00 p. m. 
Wednesday Praver Meeting.. .  7:30 p. m.

^ Ulll'!LSHlilVÆS
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
Sunday SchooL . .  10:15 a. m. 
Morning Worship.. .  11; 00 a. m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
H. A. Tarkington, pastor 
Sunday SchooL . .  9:45 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  11:00 a. m.
G. A. 's and W. M. C. . . .  6:15 p. m. 
Evangelistic Service.. .  7:00 p. m. 
Wednesday Bible Study.. .  7:00 p. m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
J. L Bozeman, Pastor 
Sunday SchooL . .  9:45am 
Morning Worship.. . 11:00 a. m.
Training Union. . .  6:00 p. m.
Youth Chior Sunday.. .  4:30 p. m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting. . .  7:30 p. m.

HILLSIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST
Gary Ball, Minister
Sunday SchooL . .  10;00 a. m.
Morning Worship.. .  10:55 a. m.
Eyeping Worship.. . 6:00 p. m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting.. .  7:00 p. m.

PLAINS CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Morning Worship.. .  10:30 a. m. 
Evening Worship.. .  7:00 p. m.

TOKIO BAPTIST CHURCH 
Sunday SchooL . .  10; 00 a. m. 
Morning Worship.. .  11:00 a. m. 
Training Union.. .  6: 00 p. m. 
Evening Worship.. .  7:00 p. m.
W. M. U. . . .  Tuesday.. .  10:00 a. m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting and 
Youth Activities.. .  7:00 p. m.

SACRED HEART CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Rev. James Dwann, S. A. C.
Christian Doctrine Classes Sunday.. .  10:00 a. m. 
Tuesday Mass.. .  8:00 p. m.
Friday Mass.. .  8; 00 p. m.
Confessions and Baptismal Services., .  7:00-8:00 p. m. 
Saturday Evening

PLEASANT HILL UNION ASSEMBLY 
Roger Rounsaville, Pastor 
Sunday SchooL . .  10:00 a. m.
Sunday Night.. . .  7:00 p. m. 
Tuesday Night.. .  7:30 p. m. 
Thursday Night. .  7:30 p. m.

Plains Oil Co 

Ruby Heald

Raymond Bookout 

Viva's Beauty Shop 

Ray Trent

Royce Trout

Olan Heath

Hotkey LP Gas & Shell Sta. 

Tom Warren 

Plains State Bank 

Plains Nursing Home 

Gene Bennett

EASTER

Joe Deaton 

Moore & Oden 

Wilda Hancock 

Pic & Pay Grocery

Barron Blair

Polly Rushing 

Hawkins Food Store 

Roy Guetersloh 

Nelms Texaco 

Cogburn—Young 

Ira Tidwell

Plains Frozen Food The Plains Record



★ ★  Speaking Success ★ *
Approximately 80 persons at­

tended the Saturday night sup­
per and candidate speaking at 
the Tokio Community Building. 
The event was co-sponsored by 
the Turner Home Demonstrate 
on Club and the Community.

Candidates attending from 
Yoakum County wereE. W. 
'Elvis " Craig, seeking re- e le c ­
tion for County tax-assessor and 
collector; and Vance Brown, 
who is seeking re-election  for 
Commissioner o f  Precinct 1.

Letters from Ray Trent, seek­
ing the county tax o ffice , and 
Ruby HeaId, County Clerk, we­
re read offering their apologi­
es and regrets for not getting 
to attend.

Two district candidates atte- 
nding^^re R. B. "Mac "M cA ll­
ister ^® R obert Manskin, both 
o f  Lut^^k.who are seeking the 
state representative position for 
PI. 3. Johnny Kendrick, seeking 
re-election  was unable to att­
end because o f o ffic ia l busin­
ess in Austin.

Terry County Candidates in­
cluded Homer Parker, L. C. We­
bster and Eddie Roe. all seeki-

ng the sheriff’s o ffice ; J. D.
"Jot" Akers and C liff Jones,se­
eking the tax office;Bobby Gi­
lliam , John A. Bost, O. O. Mi­
ller, Geo. Steele and Harvey 
Smith all seeking the Prec. 1 
Commissioners Post; Kenneth 
Graves and H. B. "D oc" Settl­
ers, seekina the Prec. 3 Com ­
missioners Post. A letter from 
O. A. Pippin was read offering 
his regrets for not being able to 
attend. He is also seeking the 
Prec. 3 office.

Other letters read included 
one from J. O. Burnett, Terry 
County Clerk.

Pies and cakes were auction- eight pounds per acre produc 
ed o ff to the highest bidders af- ed 2, 640 pounds.

SEEDING RATES DISCUSSED 
BY LEO W H ITE...................

The amount o f  seed planted 
on an acre o f  ground can bec­
ame a pretty important item , 
before harvest time gets arou­
nd. This was shown in two cas­
es published in the 1967 Crops 
Demonstration Handbook. A se­
eding rate demonstration was 
carried out by Henry May to 
show the difference in yield 
o f  grain sorghum when planted 
at the rate o f  eight pounds per 
acre compared with a planting 
rate o f  five Dounds per acre. 
The low seeding rate produced 
2, 812 pounds o f grain per acre 
while the high seeding rate o f

i— HEALTH & SAFETY -

M ainly for Mothers
by C a ro l H a rt

QUICK SNACK

ter the speaking. Johnnie Fitz­
gerald, Yoakum County Com­
missioner o f  Prec. 4, attended 
this part o f  the event also.

Other guests included Bob 
Wiley o f  San Antonio and Pan- 
Noi Thehospdin o f  Thailand , 
students at Texas Tech,who at­
tended with the Clyde Trout 
family.

Approximately 4oo dollars 
was raised at the affair and wi­
ll be divided amoung the c o ­
sponsors.

BEFORE IT HAILS.

IT HAPPENS EVERY YEAR. THE HAIL 

FALLS BEFORE YOU GET THAT VALU- 

A BLE PROTECTION.

SEE OR CALL YOUR FARM BUREAU 

INSURANCE AGENT SOON. YOU MAY 

BE ABLE TO SAVE SOME MONEY WITH 

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE THIS YEAR.

WE HAVE A SPECIAL PROGRAM FOR 

SEMI-LONG STAPLE COTTON.

TEXAS FARM BUREAU
INSURANCE COMPANIFS

Dick McGinty & Bob Rucker 
AGENTS

In this case the difference ■ 
was not great and it may not 
work out that way every year, 
butitwas proof enough for Mr.
May because he plans to plant
all ofhis irrigated grain sorgh­
um in 1967 with only five pou­
nds o f  seed per acre.

Another seeding rate demon­
stration published in the hand- .....
book shows the results o f  tw o j j e removeci each one.) 
seeding rates on wheat. Mr. K.
Blounthasa small irrigated fa­
rm northwest o f  Plains where 
he planted wheat in the fall o f 
1966. The two rates used were 
nineteen and a half pounds c o ­
mpared with thirty-eight pou­
nds. There was no significant 
difference in the yield, both

1 /
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World’s Greatest Tasters Are in Playpen Set

The most adventurous tasters in the world are under the age of 
five. They will taste anything they can touch. Annually, thousands of 
children, most of them under the age of five, sample medicines and 
household products of an astonishing variety. Although most recover, 
the experience can be a harrowing one — and is preventable in nine 
out of ten cases.

The Council on Family Health, 
a non-profit organization created 
to promote health and safety in 
the home, has some pertinent sug­
gestions.

Most important is to look at 
your home through the eyes of 
your child. To him, it’s an excit­
ing, eolorful place with hundreds 
of things to touch and taste.
(Recently a safety expert with a 
new addition to the family car­
ried out a room by room inspec­
tion of his home and found 41 
potentially poisonous substances 
within reach of a crawling child.

The room with the highest 
accident potential is the kitchen. 
Detergents, bleach, insecticides, 
floor polish, disinfectant, room 
deodorizers and even paints are 
often stored in floor-level cab­
inets behind easy-to-open doors. 
These products should be removed

made over twenty-six bushels to a higher location, separate 
per acre when they were harv- f r °™ f °°d cabinets. Store pots 
ested last May. and Pans in the fIo o r  level

It will soon be planting time cabinets, 
for grain sorghum and farmers Knives, corkscrews, can open- 
are cautioned to remember the ers and other sharp objects are 
" Thunb Rule " o f  one pound ofoften kept in waist-high drawers, 
seed for each one thousand po - within the reach of a child. They 
unds o f  expected production . should be placed on wall racks or 
A farm that is well iriigated a high shelf, 
and has the correct amount o f  Electric outlets not in use can 
fertilizer applied might prod- be covered with special plastic 
uce as much as 5, 000 pounds caps.
o f  grain per acre. If this is true During meal preparation, pots 
then five pounds o f seed per and pans should have their han- 
acre would be the correct pla-dles turned inward, away from
ntingrate.Any more seed than 
that would make the crop less 
drought resistant with a small­
er stalk and a smaller root sy­
stem for drawing the moisture 
and plant food out o f  the soil 
and changing it into something 
to haul to town.

Even though moisture condi­
tions are favorable for making 
a good crop o f dry land grain 
sorghum this year, the whole 
thing can be easily ruined at 
planting tim e by putting down 
three pounds o f seed per acre 
when two pounds would be suf­
ficient.

ROLLED BISCUITS 
2 cups New Bisquick 
y2 cup cold water
Heat oven to 450°. Stir ingredi­
ents with fork to a soft dough. 
Gently smooth dough into a 
ball on floured cloth-covered 
board. Knead 5 times. Roll %  
inch thick. Cut with 2-inch 
floured cutter. Bake on un­
greased baking sheet 8 to 10 
minutes. Makes 10 to 12 bis­
cuits.
Quick Parker House Rolls: Fol­
low recipe for Rolled Biscuits 
(above) except —  roll dough 
14 inch thick and cut with 2%- 
inch biscuit cutter. Brush eact 
round lightly with melted but­
ter and fold in half, pressing 
edges together. Place r o l l s  
close together in ungreased 
9x1%-inch round l a y e r  or 
9x9x2-inch square pan. Makes 
12 to 16.

a child’s grasp.

Butter Sticks: Heat oven to 
450°. Melt %  cup butter or 
margarine in oblong pan, 13x9- 
x2 inches. Follow recipe for 
Rolled Biscuits (left) except —  
roll dough into rectangle, 10x6 
inches. Cut lengthwise in half. 
Cut each hhlf into 12 strips, 
each about %  inch wide. Dip 
each stick in melted butter to 
coat all sides; arrange in pan. 
Bake 12 to 15 minutes. Serve 
hot. Makes 24 sticks.
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Í  HAM MAKES GOOD
Good eating, that is. Es­
pecially when you serve 
it with this wonderful 
Fruit Cocktail-Currant 
Jelly sauce. (And you 
know how popular Fruit 
Cocktail is.) You make 
it th is way: scoop  a

je lly  into a saucepan. 
Add a medium-size can 
of drained Fruit Cock­
tail. Then a teaspoon of 
d iy  mustard. Heat and 
stir until jelly is melted. 
Try it tonight with your 
favorite canned, bone-

ran
The bedroom can be a hazard­

ous area for a child, particularly 
if his mother leaves medicines, 
cosmetics, perfumes, lotions and 
sharp items such as nail files, 
tapered combs and tweezers on 
night tables or on low dressers. 
All should be stored out of sight 
after use.

In the bathroom, all medicines 
and grooming aids should imme­
diately be returned to their 
proper enclosed place. Medicine 
chests equipped with snap locks 
will deter the young climber 
from tasting products not de­
signed for his palate.

In short, to see your home with 
the eyes of a child is to be a most 
effective parent in preventing 
needless accidents.

ELECT

■

YOAKUM COUNTY
Subject To Action Of 

The Democratic Primary

MAY 4
Paid P olitica l Advertisement By Supporters Of Joe Deaton.

Half-Moon Salads
Cut half of a large honeydew 
melon into 12 slices; trim off 
rind. Pare and s e c t i o n  3 
oranges. On 6 luncheon plates, 
arrange melon slices and orange 
sections on beds of lettuce. 
Garnish with parsley. 6 serv­
ings.
Coffee for the grownups, milk 
for the youngsters. And there. 
That should tide them over 
until the big Easter dinner.

HONORS
FROM PAGE ONE

Students qualifying for the 
Regional Meet April 20 are as 
follows:
Persuasive Speaking:

B, Kennedy.
Science:

R. Jones, B. Kennedy, L. V. 
Edwards, alternate.
Number Sense:

R. Jones and :-E. Kreig.
Slide Rule:

B. Kennedy, C. Smith, P. 
Layton, alternate.
Typing:

R. Field, Y. Ramos, alterna­
te.

Representing Plains in Regi­
onal tennis play in boys double 
will be Jackie McDonnell and 
Robert Field.

Regional volleyball play will 
be held in Lubbock, T ues., Ap­
ril 16. Members o f  the Cowgi­
rls are Debbie Thompson, Ma­
rilyn Goehry, Linda Blair, Jo - 
Ann Kerrick, Sharon Tarking- 
ton, Kathy Anderson, Lou Ella 
Turner, Dianne Fitzgerald, Ph­
yllis,Kreig, Joyce Warren, Ch­
arlene Gayle, and Suzhan St. 
Romain.

Boys eligible to com pete in 
the Regional Track Meet are: 
440 Yd. Relav-C. Smith, G. Jo­
nes, Joe Pierce, DanField, and

GIOVANNI’S SALAD

In advance: Cover 'A clove gar­
lic with 2 tablespoons salad oil; 
let stand. Prepare 2 cups crou­
tons. Place 3 quarts dry, cold, 
crisp salad greens in large bowl. 
Add Vi cup each salad oil, 
grated Parmesan cheese and 
crumbled blue cheese. Salt and 
pepper to taste. Break I coddled 
egg over greens. (Coddle egg in 
shell by covering in pan with 
cold water; heat to boiling and 
b o il 1 m inute. D rain and 
promptly cool in cold water.) 
Squeeze juice of 2 lemons over 
egg. Toss with abandon!

Just before serving, remove gar­
lic from oil; combine oil and 
croutons and sprinkle over top 
of salad. 6 large servings.

VOTE FOR
IRl TIDWELL

j

Candidate For
COMMISSIONER PRECINCTS 

Your Vote And Influence Appreciated

Paid Political Advertisement By Irs Tidwell.

Gary Liles, alternate.
120 Y d. H. H. -C . Smith.

Jones 
Kennedy

220 Yd.
880 Yd.

Dash-G. 
Dash - B.

Discus-B. Yaylor.
Smith will abso com pete in 

the pole vault and running br­
oad jump events.

Jr. High and Elementary st­
udents placing in U. L L. eve­
nts Sat. are:
Number Sense;

Shelley Simpson, first, James 
Stewart, second.
Ready Writing.

Rojanno Harvey, second. 
Story Telling.

Brad Crump.
The Jr. High Track team pl­

aced second in district play 
Friday in Coahoma with 142 
points. Coahoma placed first 
with 161 points.

Events and results are as fo l­
lows:
440_Relay-Arthur Tagle, Louis
Howard, Charles Fisher, Randy 
Fitzhugh,second with 50. 6.
50 Yd Dash-Mike Cox, fifth.
100 Yd Dash-Fitzhugh, 1st, with
12. 5.
220 Yd Dash-Fitzhugh, 2nd.
with 26. 0
60 Yd H. H .-Howard, second, 
Simpson, 3rd, Chandler, 5th. 
120 Yd. L H, -Howard, 1st, with
15. 6, Chandler, 4th, Simpson, 
5th.
660 Yd. Run-  Gene Wauson, Isl 
with 1;40. 6 ., Manual Ramos, 
3rd., Andrew Ruiz, 5ht.
880 Relay- Tagle, Chandler, C-
ox. Fisher, 3 rd.
Broad Jump- Fitahugh, 3 rd. ,
Simpson, 6 th.
Discus: - Simpson, 1 st. with a 
125ft. , Ruiz, third with 110 ft. 
Pole Vault; -  Chandler tied for 
first with 8. 6, Tagle tied for 
third with 8. 0, Joey Lowe tied 
for fifth w ith 7. 6.
High Tump: - Simpson, fourth 
with 4ft. Sin.

EflSTE VALUES
PERFECT EASTER DINNERS /

QUALITY BEEF— LB.

T BONE STEAKS %

18

Ge^

KRAFT SAUCE

18 OZ.

6o,

Chef Boy-ar-Dee
CHEESE PIZZA Green Onions Bradt-Each

2/15c

FRENCH DRESSING

- 2  5<KRAFT 8 OZ. CELLO

Hl-C DRINKS
CELE!

46 OZ.

SHURFINE

Peas&Carrot- 2-39C
VELVEETA CHEESE 

2 ib $1.05

c* BAG

A #

PO TATO ES
59<

Food Market
The B e tte r Things Are Yours! 
w ith  GOLD B O N D  Stam ps!

■%>

4 *yc
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W H E N  I T  C O M E S  T O  6 R E A S E  F / R E S ,

WATER WON'T WORK!
I: y/

SEWING CLASS: Pictured are the ladies who have completed 
their dresses in the class. Left to right are Elvira Jimenez,Eu- 
lalio Martinez and Irma Lozos.

r ~  Vm &  i j i  11—
y 0

The Extra Ingredient 
. . .  Professional Skill

W lu-n nur n ‘"istere<l pharma- 
ci-t> r>>m|inmi(l a prescription. 
\ ear- ol professional training, 
know led-»* and experience  
stand l>eltind it. Have your 
]»re~< ription> iilled here, with 
conip 1 et** confid ence. F re sh , 
potent drugs . . . and prompt 
service, too.

y jF \ 
I ThrOW/A/6 BA KINO SOPA ON BURN IN & UREASE 

W/LL HELP PUT IT  OUT. PEEP A B /&  BOX | NANPV/ (ANP KEEP VOUR STOVE clean.)

W e  Are in Business 
for Your Good Health!

Cu r r y  Dr ug
hr\ /^ jr

$ $ y E a $ t e r
Plains 
State  
Bank,g |

Webb Services 
Held Friday

Services for Oarie Lee (Bud­
dy) Webb were held at 2 p. m. 
Friday in the Seagraves First 
Baptist Church with the Rev . 
Ray Martin o f  Coleman and the 
Rev. Gordon Smith officiating.

Webb, 43, died at 1 a. m. 
Thursday in the Lubbock Met­
hodist Hospital following an 
extended illness.

Burial was in the Seagraves 
Cemetary under the direction 
o f Webb Funeral Home.
Webb, a farmer, moved to 
the Pleasant Hill area 10 years 
ago from O'Donnell.

Hewas a member o f the Ma­
sonic Lodge, the Order o f  East­
ern Star, and o f  the Pleasant 
Hill Baptist Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
La Rue, three sons, Dana Lee 
and Roger, both o f the home, 
and Paul o f  Lubbock; his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Hubert We- 
eb o f O'Donnell; a sister, Mrs. 
Bobby Sinco o f  Lamesa, two 
brothers, R. O. o f  Seagraves , 
and Jack o f O'Donnell; and a 
grandchild.
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A special thanks goes to me­
mbers o f  Tsa Mo Ga, Iota Pi So­
rority, Christian Women's Fel­
lowship, Home Demonstration 
Clubs, Order o f  Eastern Star , 
Plains Dirt Gardners, Young 
Homemakers Club and the Fi­
ne Arts Club, for their partici­
pation in the House to House 
Crusade April 2.

The Yoakum County Unit o f  
the American Cancer Society.

Yoakum County 
Hospital News

ADMITTED
March 31: Mrs. Troy Denton, 
Jettie L. Sefick, Mrs. Joyce 
Shipley, Charles Spencer and 
Mrs. Dorothy Stokes.
April 1: Mrs. Reva Cleaveland, 
Donna Lynn Comer, Mrs. Olive 
Faulkenberry and W. M. Bund- 
ick.
April 2: Terry Maynard, Mrs. 
Jewell Lewis, Vickye Faulke­
nberry.
DISMISSED
April 1: Mrs. Terry Lynn Sull- 
ins and baby, Mrs. Carrie Co­
peland, Mrs. Amelia .Rodriquez, 
Mrs. Beverly Martin, Mrs. Sue 
Scott and Dave Boulter.
April 2: Pencie McRae, Dolores 
Rodriquez and Shirley Hick.

Farmers Home 
Gives Report

A total o f  $3, 068, 890 in lo ­
an funds has been used in Y o­
akum County to support fami­
ly farms since July 1,1964, Ho­
mer P. Cole local supervisor for 
the rural credit agency said to­
day.

Approximately $833, 290 was 
advanced in 1967.

Currently 91 rural families in 
Yoakum County are using the 
supervised credit services o f  the 
Farmers Home Administration .

The supply o f  FHA credit, wh­
ich supplements the credit sup­
plied by banks and other priva­

te family farmers and opportu­
nity to earn part o f  income.

These loans have enabled fa-

rmers to stay in business who 
would otherwise have to give up 
and go tho the city. They have 
helped young farmers get esta­
blished.They have enabled fa­
rmers to keep going after the 
drought conditions in the past, 
Mr. Cole noted.

F. H. A. loans can be used to 
buy land, refinance debts, acq­
uire livestock and eauipment, 
pay fertilizer and fuel bills and 
pay other expences connected 
with acquiring, improving and 
operating farms.

The incomes o f  farmers us­
ing F. H. A. credit in Yoakum 
County in 1967 totaled appro­
ximately $1, 531, 504. 00.

Loans are made only to fam­
ilies who are unable to obtain 
credit from other sources, The 
program is tailored to individ­
ual family needs and loans 
are accompanied by technical 
assistance in farm and money 
managemant.

IN 19 68 V IS IT 
HEMISFAIR® 
TEX AS
W O RLD ’S FAIR 
SAN A N TO N  10 
APR. 6 — O C T. 6

The Yoakum C ou n y^ R tce  
is located at Plains, tH R  on 
the 1st floor o f tne Old C o iit- 
house.

4̂ » in is  Ad paid For By Roy Guetersioti b

The Job Of Serving 

You As Commissioner Of 

Precinct 3

ROY D. GUETERSLOH
This Ad Paid For By Roy Guetersloh

Half or Whole

HAMS

L B . ;

3 lb. Diamond

721 MAR'66 M.P. JO

Ì

No. 1

POTATOES

i\

FRANKS 39*
12 oz. Glover

s
FRONTIER

SAVING
STAMP

t a m e 8
W o

PICKLES
Kimbell Qt. 

Dill or Sour

4 Rolls

Q  Bordens Asst. Flavors
1/2 Gal.

TISSUE

Ê? DOG FOOD
KIM

4/39* Del Monte-

j t  I ' j L i u / n ^  fs& \
f r o z e n  p o o r s

CATSUP
Hunt's 20 oz.

Open 7 a.m. to 7 p.m.

Saturday 

7 a.m. to 8 p.m.

THIS COUPON IS GOOD FOR 100 FREE 

FRONTIER STAMPS WITH PURCHASE 

OF $5. 00 OR MORE AT PLAINS FROZEN 

FOOD - - - .............. -PLAINS, TEXAS

NAME

DOUBLE on Wednesday

Across From Post Office
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