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Borden County 
ISD Selected 
High-Performance 
Reward School for 
2013-2014 School 
Year
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By Local & Area Talent 

PIE, CAKE & COBBLER AUCTION

Saturday, October 11th 
:00 p.m. Borden Co. Event Center

No Admission 
©nations Accepted

The Borden County Inde­
pendent School District was re­
cen tly  nam ed as a d is tin ­
guished High-Performing Re­
ward School for the 2013-2014 
school year. A high-perform­
ing school is a school that re­
ceives distinction designations 
based on math and reading per­
formance at the high school 
level along with the highest 
graduation rates (at least 90%). 
A reward school has met all 
federally required annual mea­
surable objectives on each of 
the system safeguards evalu­
ated for all students and sub­
groups in both math and read­
ing.

There are 63 school districts 
in the Education Service Cen­
ter Region, and most o f those 
districts have m ultiple cam­
puses. The Borden County In­
dependent School District is 
one o f only three K-12 schools 
in the region and only twenty 
K-12 districts out of approxi­
mately one thousand school 
districts in Texas met all o f the 
criteria to be recognized as a 
High-Performing School and a 
High-Progress School. This 
is an outstanding honor and ac­
complishment. We commend 
our students, faculty, and the 
Borden County School Com­
m unity for this accom plish­
ment.

m m m m m  ar— armMEMBER
2014

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION!
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Quick Start Propels Coyotes to 
Victory Over #7 Ropes Eagles
By Coach Richey

The Borden County Coy­
otes returned to the field Fri­
day after taking a week off and 
showed no signs of being rusty 
early in this match-up with 
state Ranked Ropes Eagles. 
The Eagles came into this con­
test with a 4-1 record and their 
only blemish was at the hands 
of the then # 1 Ranked Ira Bull­
dogs 56 to 28. In fact in that 
contest the Eagles had the ball 
inside the Bulldog 5 yard line 
3 times without scoring so that 
score could be even closer. 
With that being said, the Coy­
otes knew that their week off 
would be needed as they pre­
pared for one of the top foot­
ball teams in the state.

The Coyote defense came 
out of the gates playing well 
and gave the ball back to the 
home town Coyotes in good 
field position. They wasted 
little time in getting on the 
board as Corbin Sumners fol­
lowed the blocks o f center 
Frank Banman, guard Sean 
Tucker, end Korbin Martinez, 
fullback Trace R ichey and 
quarterback Hunter Jones and 
rum bled  11 yards to the 
endzone and a quick 6-0 lead 
with 6:13 left in the first. Riley 
Herridge booted the extra point 
kick out of the hold o f Mason 
Coor to push the lead to 8-0. 
The Borden County defense of 
B anm an, Tucker, R ichey, 
Sum ners, Jones, M artinez, 
Jay ton  Lew is and Ryan 
Willbom again forced a quick 
turnover on downs and the 
Coyotes began their march to 
another score. This drive 
proved to be one o f the long­
est of the year but in the end 
Jones connected with Sean 
Tucker on a 2 yard scoring 
strike to increase the Coyote 
lead to 14-0.

The Eagles used a couple of 
Coyote penalties to continue 
their next drive which culmi­
nated with a score to cut the 
lead to 14 to 8. The home team 
would answer moments later 
as Sum ners reached  the 
endzone again, this time from 
2 yards out and with another 
Herridge kick the Coyotes had 
a 22 to 8 lead. With yet an­
other great effort by the kick­
off coverage team the Eagles 
would start deep in their own

territory. This group consists 
o f  H erridge, Coor, Lew is, 
Noah Morales, Colby Pennell, 
Cayden Vaughn and Willbom. 
After another defensive stop 
the Coyotes wasted no time 
increasing their lead as Jones 
hit Banman with a 23 yards 
scoring strike and with the 
H erridge kick the Coyotes 
were up 30-8. But, on the next 
Eagles offensive possession a 
busted assignment resulted in 
a long touchdown mn for the 
visitors and the momentum for 
the visitors cutting the lead to 
30 to 16. The Borden County 
offense however would answer 
im m edia te ly  as C orbin 
Sumners squirted free on a nice 
55 yard mn to regain the mo­
mentum. Herridge hit Colby 
Pennell for the extra point and 
a 37 to 16 lead.

After forcing the ball over 
on downs the Coyotes would 
take possession of the ball with 
just a little over a minute left 
in the half. The Coyotes 
showed great composure in 
driving the ball down the field 
and in the end came away with 
a score on the final play of the 
first half as Sumners took a 
pitch from Jones to scamper in 
for the score. The R iley  
Herridge kick made the half­
time score 45 to 16 and the 
home team would get the ball 
to start the second half.

The Coyotes would 
again waste little time in get­
ting on the board again as 
Hunter Jones would move to 
tailback as Sumners would sit 
the rest of the second half with 
a bmised thigh suffered on the 
first play o f the second half. 
L ater on that drive senior 
Ricky Torres would re-injure 
his shoulder and he would miss 
the majority of the second half 
as well. Already missing this 
contest was senior N athan 
Ham . Jones m eanw hile 
sp rin ted  37 yards to the 
endzone to give the Coyotes a 
commanding 51 to 16 lead and 
with the Herridge extra point 
kick, Borden County would be 
a stop and score away from 
ending this game early with 
their 53 to 16 lead.

The Eagles however had 
different plans as they found 
the home team making a few

m istakes defensively  that 
would result in the visitors 
hanging around getting scores 
on their first 4 possessions of 
the second half. Meanwhile 
the Coyotes would fall short 
offensively on their next pos­
session as a dropped pass 
would turn the ball over on 
downs giving the Eagles a 
quick 16-0 run to make this 
game a lot closer than it actu­
ally was at 53 to 32. The Coy­
otes would regain the momen­
tum on their next offensive 
possession as Jones hooked up 
with Frank Banman with a 50 
yard scoring pass. Herridge 
w ould again  connect w ith 
Pennell for the point after and 
the Coyotes were up 60 to 32. 
Another Eagle score would 
make it 60 to 40 but again 
Borden County would answer 
as Jones hit Colby Pennell with 
a 30 yard scoring pass, and 
Herridge would add the point 
after kick to make it 68 to 40. 
The Eagles would answer one 
more time due to a coverage 
bust making the score 68 to 48, 
but that is all the defense would 
allow the rest of the way.

Meanwhile the offense con­
tinued to score as Trace Richey 
finished off a drive that he 
started with a nice interception. 
R ichey rum bled in from 8 
yards out to make the score 74 
to 48. The defense stopped the 
Eagles again and then the of­
fense would put the game away 
as Mason Coor juked his way 
to pay dirt from 10 yard out. 
The final Herridge kick made 
the score 82 to 48. Another 
defensive stop would bring a 
close to this tough contest and 
improve the Coyotes to 5-0 on 
the season and set up a match 
with Water Valley next week. 
The Coyotes look forward to 
this challenge as they have 
never come away with a vic­
tory in Water Valley.

Statistically for the Coyotes: 
Ryan Willbom had 4 tackles 
and 2 carries for 24 yards, 
Noah Morales had 3 tackles. 
Frank Banman had 11 tackles 
and 3 catches for 82 yards and 
2 scores. Cayden Vaughn had 
5 tackles including a sack. 
Mason Coor had 3 tackles and

(Continued to Pg. 3)
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Coyote JV Defeat the 
Eagles in Third Quarter

Pups Improve to 3-0 
With Win Over Eagles

By Coach Richey

The Borden County JV got 
back to their winning ways af­
ter losing a tough game last 
w eek to the Lubbock 
Homeschool Titans. Borden 
County only needed 3 quarters 
to win this game as it was 
ended due to the mercy rule for 
the third time for the 2014 Coy­
otes who have been playing 
some amazing games this sea­
son. The Coyotes had to deal 
with adversity this week as 
starting center Braxton Barnes 
continues to battle an illness 
and the Coyotes also had a 
member of their team decide 
to go a different direction, so 
they would have to make due 
and use the adage that has been 
our battle cry all year, “Next 
Man Up”. That’s just what this 
group did and boy did they put 
on a show.

N ick  P rou lx  w ould  get 
things started for the Coyotes 
as he rumbled 15 yards to the 
endzone and a quick 6-0 lead 
for Borden County. Paving the 
way most of the evening were 
linemen Braxton Coor, Diego 
Bernal, Steven Carrillo, Dylan 
M urphy and fullback Brian 
Torres along with signal caller 
Morgan Wilson. The other two 
key members of the Coyotes 
success on this cool October 
evening were Thomas Nix and 
Josh Murphy.

D ylan M urphy m ade a 
heads up play on the Coyotes 
next defensive possession as he 
batted down a 4th down pass to 
give them possession o f the 
ball closer to the endzone. 
Dylan would be credited with 
an interception for this heads 
up play. Moments later, Nick 
Proulx had Borden County 
back on the scoreboard with 
another run. Proulx then found 
his extra point combination 
w ith Braxton Coor for the 
point after and a 13-0 lead in 
the first quarter. After a Proulx 
interception, Proulx and the 
Coyote offense reached pay 
dirt again, this time from 35 
yards out and with another 
hookup with Coor they had a 
commanding 20-0 lead after 
one period of play. The Coy­
otes got another defensive stop 
in the second quarter and Brian 
Torres wasted little time add­
ing to their lead, as he sprinted 
56 yards to the endzone and 
w ith  a P roulx  to S teven

Carrillo extra point the Borden 
County had a 27 to 0 lead.

The Coyotes got a sweet in­
terception and return from 
Thomas Nix on their next de­
fensive possession. In fact 
Thomas made a sweet spin 
move and looked like he was 
going to score only to get 
tangled up with a teammate. 
But on the first play after his 
pick, Morgan Wilson hit Tho­
mas with a nice 17 yard pass 
and catch play. Proulx ran in 
the point after and a comfort­
able 34 to 0 lead. On the next 
defensive possession  N ick 
Proulx had his second intercep­
tion and the coyotes 4th as a 
team , th is tim e how ever, 
Proulx took the pick all the way 
to the endzone and another 
Coyote score. They would 
now be one stop away from 
ending this contest at half lead­
ing 40-0. The Eagles however 
had a different play as they 
scored to make the game 40 to 
8 at half.

Borden County would an­
swer on their first possession 
o f the second half as Brian 
Torres found the endzone from 
11 yards out. Proulx hit Coor 
again for the point after and the 
Coyotes had a 47 to 8 lead. 
After a nice defensive stop the 
C oyotes m anaged  ano ther 
march to the endzone as Torres 
brought the game to a close as 
the combination o f his long run 
and a proulx extra point gave 
the Coyotes a dominating 54 to 
8 victory, ending the game af­
ter 3 quarters of play.

The Coyotes now 3 -1 on the 
season will next play a very 
tough Water Valley Wildcat 
football team. Thank you all 
for your support and we en­
courage you all to come sup­
port the Coyotes Thursday in 
this home game.

THANK
YOU
FOR

READING
THE

By Coach Richey

The Borden County Pups 
improved to 3-0 on the season 
with a convincing win over the 
home team Ropes Eagles. The 
Pups wasted little time in tak­
ing a lead that they would 
never give up as they recov­
ered an Eagle fumble and then 
methodically marched the ball 
down the field using dominat­
ing blocking by the first seven 
players o f 8th graders Riley 
Lewis, JW Nix, Ben Justice, 
P ayton  M erket, Jerem y 
Souder and Lukas Grantham 
and 7th grader Will Yarbro. 
Justice was the recipient of the 
blocking early as he reached 
pay dirt with a 12 yard touch­
down run and then followed it

(Continued from  Pg. 2)

had 11 carries for 65 yards and 
a score. Corbin Sumners had 
4 tackles and 13 carries for 151 
yards and 4 scores. Trace 
Richey had 12 tackles, a tackle 
for loss, an interception and a 
pass broken up. Also 2 rushes 
for 34 yards and a score and 2 
catches for 32 yards. Jayton 
Lewis had 7 tackles and a 
tackle for loss. Hunter Jones 
had 5 tackles was 9 of 13 pass­
ing for 181 yards and 4 scores 
and 5 carries for 75 yards and 
a score. Ricky Torres had sev­
eral good blocks before leav­
ing with the shoulder injury. 
Korbin Martinez had 8 tack-

with a 3 yard run for the extra 
point and a quick 7-0 lead. Af­
ter another defensive stop lead 
by the sam e seven Pups, 
Borden was able to extend 
their lead to 13-0 when Payton 
Merket hit Riley Lewis with a 
nice 24 yard touchdown strike. 
The Pups second team unit of 
Conner Wagner, Jake Avey, 
Olivia Reyes, Junior Gray, Ja­
son Robinson, Colbin Briley 
and Ryan Rathbun attempted 
the next extra point, Lukas 
Grantham played tailback for 
this group with the absence of 
Anthony Lopez who will be 
out a few more weeks with a

(Continued to Pg. 7)

les. Sean Tucker had 11 tack­
les, a tackle for loss and 2 
catches for 22 yards and a 
score. Colby Pennell had 5 
tackles, 3 catches for 36 yards 
and a score and two point af­
ter catches. Riley Herridge 
was 7 of 9 kicking and was 2 
of 2 passing on extra points.

Great win guys, a statement 
game and a measuring stick 
game. Keep working toward 
the goal and the dream. Thank 
you all for your support. 
P lease come support these 
young men next week in Wa­
ter Valley.

Coyotes Defeat ...

School
Lunch
Menu

Oct. 13-17, 2014
Menu subject to 

change

M o n d a y  - B reakfast: 
Pancake Pup, F ruit Juice 
and M ilk. Lunch: M eaty  
Pasta Bake, garden Salad, 
M ashed Potatoes, Grapes, 
B re a d s tic k s , C h o c o la te  
Chip Cookie and Milk.

Tuesday - B re ak fas t: 
C ereal & C heese  S tick , 
F ru it  Ju ic e  and  M ilk . 
Lunch: Chicken Sandwich, 
Oven Fries, Fresh Veggie 
Cup, Fruit and Milk.

Wednesday - Breakfast: 
B re a k fa s t P o c k e t, F ru it 
Ju ice  and  M ilk . L unch : 
Pizza, Tomato & Cucumber 
C up , B aby  C a rro ts  w / 
Ranch, M andarin Oranges 
and Milk.

T h u r s d a y -B re a k fa s t:  
Blueberry Muffin & Yogurt, 
F ru it  Ju ic e  and  M ilk . 
L unch : G ir lle d  C heese  
Sandw ich, Tom ato Soup, 
Garden Salad, Pears, Lime 
Sherbet Cup and Milk.

F r i d a y - B r e a k f a s t :  
PB&J, Fruit Juice and Milk. 
L unch : P iz za  S tick s  w / 
Sauce, Baked Beans, Broc­
coli Salad, Apple & Pine­
apple and Milk.

This institution is an equal 
opportunity provider.

The
Borden

Star
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A g riLife .
EXTENSION

Julie Mumme Smith
Borden County Extension Agent * Family & Consumer Sciences 

P.0. Box 155 or 140 East Wilboum, Gail, TX 79738 (806)7564336
julie.smlth@agnet.tamu.edu httpilbordenjigrlffe.org

Ratebook: Borden County Extension and 4-H 

Blog: http://agrlfeextenslonbordenfo.wordpress.com
g&xmmltmiimix ceil® fi»** ASMAe/Mb S*r>«* ¡m apxi’vsiiixiizm mami s©**!»s (**, 5*6»; m  «msm mj» <x

When It Comes to Managing 
Mealtimes-What kind of a parent 

are you?
Managing what food to put 

on the table is challenging 
enough without having to man­
age who is around the table. 
There are three approaches to 
paren ting  that in fluence 
children’s eating behavior: par­
ent centered, child centered 
and balanced.

If  you take the parent cen­
tered approach, or authoritar­
ian, then you may restrict the 
type and/or amount o f food 
your child can eat. For ex­
ample, you might have a no 
junk food policy at your house. 
Another clue you may have a 
parent centered approach is if 
you stick to strict meal and 
snack times. Also you may 
expect your child to eat all of 
the food on their plate -  a clean 
plate rule. One problem with 
this approach is that children 
often desire the foods they can­
not have and will often over­
eat when offered restricted 
foods. Children who are re­
quired to finish all o f the food 
on their plate may develop a 
hab it o f  overeating  w hich 
could lead to unwanted weight 
gain over time.

The child centered approach 
(also known as permissive) to 
mealtime is very unstructured. 
Children decide w hat they 
want to eat and when they want 
to eat. They will often forage

in the kitchen for food. This 
approach to parenting can be a 
problem when children pick 
foods that are not very healthy 
resulting in overall decrease in 
nutritional intake. Also chil­
dren may not learn proper table 
manners and how to make din­
ner conversation.

The balanced approach to 
managing mealtimes is also 
called authoritative. It can be 
thought of as a happy median 
between the parent and the 
child approaches. Parents with 
a balanced approach:

* Offer meals and snacks 
regularly throughout the day 
thereby allowing children to 
feel secure

* Provide a variety  o f 
healthful foods from which 
children are allowed to select

* Introduce new foods 11 
to 12 times to allow children 
ample time to warm up to un­
familiar foods

* Create a positive meal­
time atmosphere by not com­
menting about food not eaten 
or making negative statements 
about the child

* Are good role models.
For more information on

nutrition and health, please 
con tac t the Texas A&M  
AgriLife Extension Service- 
B orden  C ounty  O ffice at 
(806)756-4336.

A  3ÜU JE"í

403 N. Austin Avenue 
Lamesa, Texas 79331 

806-872-8335 Fax: 806- 
872-8336

3rd Si 4th generations stilt serving this area.

Booster
Club
Sponsors
Homecoming
Dance

The Borden County Booster 
Club will sponsoring a dance 
on Friday, October 17, 2014. 
All Jr. High, High School and 
Exes are welcome. It will be 
held at the Borden County 
Event Center immediately fol­
lowing the Borden County sv. 
A m herst foo tball gam e. 
Classes are responsible for t 
providing the food for the 
dance:

Seniors-Desserts 
Juniors-Finger foods 
Freshmen-Chips and Dips 
Jr. High-Food of Choice (if 

you do not have a high school 
sibling)

Elementary-Food of choice 
( if  you do not have a high 
school sibling)

Booster Club will provide 
all the drings and paper goods. 
Come out and Support our 
Borden County Coyotes and 
afterwards jo in  us for some 
good music, fellowship and 
fun. Go Big Blue!

For more information con­
tact any Booster Club Officer.

! Flu Shots\
A Flu Shot clinic has1 
been scheduled for

Wednesday,
Oct 22nd

from 9a.m. - 12p.m. ■

in the nurses office at I 
Borden County 

School
A parent must I 

accompany child 
while getting the flu ! 

shot.
*1

NASA Bound!

Borden County students Kelby Kleck and her brother Klancey will be 
attending NASA’s Houston Control Center facilities this week. The two 
were among a few Texas school children who were selected after entering 
an online NASA Science contest. Kelby and Klancey will tour NASA and 
have the chance to see first hand some o f the behind-the-scenes work. Next 
week’s Borden Star will run a feature story about their experience.

CALENDAR FOR GENERAL ELECTION
and

TRUSTEE ELECTION

October 20 
October 24 
October 31

November 4

First d a y  to  v o te  e a rly  In p e rs o n  
Last d a y  to  re c e ive  a p p lic a tio n  b y  m ail 
Last d a y  to  v o te  e a rly  b y  p e rso n a l 
a p p e a ra n c e  
ELECTION DAY
Last d a y  to  re c e ive  B allot b y  M a il a t 
7 :0 0  p m

T o  a p p ly  fo r a b a llo t b y  m a ll:
Borden County Trustee Election 

B o rd e n  C o u n ty  In d e p e n d e n t S ch o o l D istrict 
P .O . B ox 9 5 , G a il, Te x a s  7 9 7 3 8  

General Election 
Jo y c e  H e rrid g e , C o u n ty  C lerk  
P .O . B ox 1 2 4 , G a il, Te x a s  7 9 7 3 8  

M U ST HAVE PHOTO IP

E a rly  v o t in g  fo r  GENERAL ELECTION w ill b e  in th e  
C o u n ty  C le rk 's  O ffice  In th e  B o rd e n  C o u n ty  
C o u rth o u s e  d u r in g  n o rm a l bu sin e ss h o u rs

E a rly  v o t in g  fo r  TRUSTEE ELECTION w ill be  at th e  
B o rd e n  C o u n ty  In d e p e n d e n t S c h o o l d u r in g  n o rm a l 
bu sin e ss h o u rs .

E le ctio n  D a y, General Election and School Trustee 
Ele ctio n  w ill b e  h e ld  Jointly at th e  P re cin ct V o tin g  
Loca tio n s. Polls o p e n  at 7 :0 0  a .m . to  7 :0 0  p„m .

C o n ta c t Jo yc e  H e rrid g e , C o u n ty  C le rk  o r  J im m y  
T h o m a s , S c h o o l S u p e rin te n d e n t if y o u  h a ve  a n y  
q u e stio n s.k

mailto:julie.smlth@agnet.tamu.edu
http://agrlfeextenslonbordenfo.wordpress.com
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/  AgriLIFE EXTENSION
Texas A&M System

B o r d e n  C o u n t y  <f-H N e w s

Educational programs of the Texas AgriUfe Extension Service are open lo ail people without regard to race, cotor, sex, disabifity, reftgion, age, or national origin. 
The Texas A&M University System, US. Department o f Agriculture, and the County Commissioners Courts o f Texas Cooperating

4-H Enrollment Time
The start of the new school year means it is also time to 

enroll in 4-H. Go to https://texas.4honline.com. Members who 
are re-enrolling will need to update their profiles. New mem­
bers will need to create a family profile and add members. If 
you need assistance with passwords, contact the Extension Of­
fice - we can help!!

Please note that there is a participation fee of $20 per 4- 
H ’er through the end of October (after November 1 it will be 
$25). For more information about the participation fee visit: 
http://texas4-h.tamu.edu/fee/. We invite parents to enroll as vol­
unteers (BC 4-H pays the screening fee) -  we would love to 
have all parents be a screened volunteerl [Note that there is a 
new volunteer enrollment fee o f $5 for previously screened 
volunteers which we ask you to pay. 4-H will pay for your ini­
tial screening as a new volunteer.]

Please feel free to contact the Extension Office if  you need 
any assistance. Looking forward to a great year for Borden 
County 4-H!!

Dreaming Up
,* If W 18 1 « So **T* Ihl 1 1 ¡Ur O T l  1 •€&

H: W9* W*%It 4TW HK®« «1» 8̂ssS8f iiil# S88 «¡»S tJg: i i #  m  ¡̂ScelP? f8swl«>

G e t T h e r e  Is O u rs.
It's sim ple, really. H o w  well yo u  retire d e p e n d s  on 
h o w  well yo u  plan today. W h e th e r re tire m e n t is 
d o w n  the  ro ad o r  just a ro u n d  th e  corner, the  m o re  
yo u  w o rk  to w a rd  y o u r go a ls  now , th e  b e tte r 
p re p a re d  yo u  can be.

P re p a rin g  fo r re tire m e n t m eans ta kin g  a lo n g -te rm  
p e rsp e ctive . W e  re c o m m e n d  b u y in g  q u a lity  Invest­
m ents a n d  h o ld in g  th e m  becau se  w e  believe  that's 
the so un d e st w a y  w e  ca n  help  yo u  w o rk  to w a rd  
y o u r goals. A t  E d w a rd  Jo n e s, w e  sp e n d  tim e  
g e ttin g  to  k n o w  y o u r retire m e n t goals so  w e  can 
help  yo u  reach the m .

To learn more about why Edward Jones 
makes sense for you, call or visit today.

Jamie K Crnkovic
Financial Advisor
8905 Benbrook Blvd Ste H 
Benbrook, TX 76126 
817-249-4219

E d w a r d  J o n e s
M A K I N G  S E N S E  O F  I N V E S T I N G

NOTICE OF GENERAL ELECTION 
{AVISO DEELECCION)

To tiie registered voters of the County of Borden, Texas:
(a fas votaries mgistrados del Condado da Borden, Texas:)

Notice is hereby given that the polling places listed below will be open from 7:00 a m . to 7:00 p m , 
November 4, 2014, for the purpose of electing state and district officers, members of the Texas 
Legislature and members of the United States Congress, as required by Section 3.003 of the Texas 
Election Code;
and to adopt or reject die proposed Constitutional Amendments as submitted by the 83rt Legislature, 3 *  
Called Session, of the State of Texas
“Pare el proposito de elegir a los fundonarios estatales y distritales, miembms del Congreso, to$ 
mimbros de fa Legislature, funcionarim del condado y funcm arm  del distrito: y con ei proposito de 
adopter o m h am rle  propuesta de enmienda constitucma! pm eriado par la Legislature 83a, 3 'Sesion 
Especial, del Estado de T exas /

LO C A TIO N S^) OF POLLING PLACES
Precinct 1A -  - First Baptist Church,Gail
Precinct 1B - - Plains Community Center
Precinct 2A- - Borden County Courthouse District Court Room
Precinct 2B -  - Vealmoor Election Bldg,
Precinct 3A * - Murphy Election Bldg,
Precinct 3B - - Pairview Election Bldg.
Precinct 4  -  - Borden County Courthouse County Court Room 
Early Voting - - Borden County Courthouse Clerks Office

(WRECCIQNfES) DE LAS CASILLAS ELECTORALES)
No. 1A en Plains Community Center
No. 1B (South Gaff) en community room de Gail
No. 2A en Courthouse de Gail
No. 2B en la sitio de votación Vealmoor
No, 3A en la sitb de votación Murphy
No, 38 en fa sitio de votación Faírview • •
No, 4 en Courthouse de Gail
Pam los que se encuentran ausente, pam eldia propuest pueden votaren omina del County Clerk en 
Gait, Texas durante fas horas normales,

Early voting by personal appearance will be conducted each weekday at: Borden County Clerk's Office 
between the hours of 8:00 a m  to 12:00 p.m, and 1:00 p.m. to 5:00 pm , beginning on October 20,2014  
and ending on October 31,2014
(La votadon adelantada en persona se tierna a cabo de lunes a viernes en: _ *

oricina del Secretatio del Destrito y Condado
entre las horns de 8:00 am a 12:00 pm y 1:00 pm a 5:00 pm a pariir del 20 de Octobre 2014 
y terminando 31 de Octobre 2014)

Applications for ballot by mail shall be mailed to:
(Las solicitudes para boletas que se votaran adelantada por com o deberán enviarse a:)

Joyce Nerridge, County Clerk 
P.O, BOX 124
Gail, Texas 79738 .

Applications for balote by mail must be received no later than the dose of business on:
October 24,2014-
(Las solicitudes para boletas que se votaran adelantada por com o deberán recibirse para §1 fm de tas 
horas de negocio el: Octobre 24, 2014)

Issued this the 6th of October, 2014,
(Emitada este día 6 de Octobre, 2014)

https://texas.4honline.com
http://texas4-h.tamu.edu/fee/
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Pups Improve to 3-0 
With Win Over Eagles

(Continued from  Pg. 3)

knee injury. This group was 
unable to convert this extra 
point which left the score at 13- 
0 after one period of play.

The Second quarter was 
m uch the same as Payton 
Merket sprinted 35 yards to 
paydirt to push the lead to 19- 
0. The second team again 
failed on their extra point play. 
Later in the 2nd quarter after 
having 3 huge plays or touch­
downs called back because of 
penalties, the Pups still man­
aged to answer as again Merket 
set sail, this time from 55 yards 
away and a convincing lead of 
25 to 0. The Eagles managed 
to make it an interesting game 
scoring on a 4th down play and 
also the last play of the half to 
cut the deficit to 25 to 8.

During halftime, the second 
team  offense and defense 
scrim m aged R opes. The 
Eagles were stuffed by the 
young Pups all but one play, 
but unfortunately that one play 
would be the difference in a 1 - 
0 halftime score as they got 
several n ice runs from  
Grantham only to fumble away 
a couple of possessions.

The second half would start 
with the Pups getting the ball. 
Merket would regain the mo­

mentum for them as he scam­
pered 47 yards for the score. 
Merket would hit Lewis for the 
point after attem pt and the 
Pups had a 32 to 8 lead. The 
Eagles would manage another 
score to cut Borden County’s 
lead to 32 to 16, but any hopes 
o f a comeback by the home 
team were squashed as Merket 
returned the ensuing kick-off 
back 67 yards and returned the 
m om entum  to the v isiting  
Pups. Ben Justice ran the point 
after attempt in and they were 
up 39 -  16. The B orden 
County defense regained their 
attitude and quickly stopped 
any Eagles hope the rest o f the 
game and managed one more 
score of their own as Justice 
reached pay dirt from 21 yards 
out. The second group came 
up just short on the point after 
to leave the score at 45 to 16. 
This would prove to be the fi­
nal score and improve the Pups 
to 3 and 0 on the season.

The Pups w ill next 
play the Water Valley Wildcats. 
Thank you all for supporting 
this young Coyote team and we 
urge you to come out Thurs­
day to support us in this chal­
lenging game with the Wild­
cats

J u n i o r V a r s i t y  2 0 1 4  S c h e d u l e
Week § Bstë M y Opponent Site Time
Stmm$r Au& ISîh FHéy (hrèm Gty Hm é : m
Mwmge Aug. 2f Thimim Beber! Lee Then 6:06
w A m W Thursday TBA m
h Sept>4-5 Thur-Fn Im imânm TBA TBA
f i Sept, !  f Ternit??■ Rankin Them TM

- Sept W Thursday TM
§5 Sept J  f Thursday N ew lime Here m
M ü t í . r * Thmém Repes Then TM
if Thursday W&ter Vulley Hem TBA
M m , W ........ Thmém Amimi Then TBA
m Ü ctJf Thursday (indy Hen 1M
m O e t J f  ' Thursday Kiwêke Hem " W "
H U N&v ( f Tkmèf 0 Berné! then TM

Cmém Tm Rickey
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Legal Notice
RAILROAD 

COMMISSION OF 
TEXAS 

OIL AND GAS 
DIVISION

DISTRICT 8A R u le  
37 Case No. 0283146

DATE OF ISSU A N C E: 
Oct. 1, 2014 Status/Permit 
No. 795041

N O TICE OF PROTEST 
DEADLINE: 5:00 pm, Nov. 5, 
2014

Address: Railroad Commis­
sioner of Texas

ATTN: Drilling Per­
mit Unit

P.O. Box 12967 
Austin, Texas 78711-

2967
Fax: (512) 463-6780
E m a i l :  

SWR37@RRC.STATE.TX.US 
NOTICE OF 

APPLICATION
N O TIC E IS HEREBY  

GIVEN that the RAW OIL & 
GAS, INC., (RRC Operator 
No. 694863) has made appli­
cation for a spacing exception 
permit under the provisions of 
Railroad Commission State­
wide Rule 37 )16 Tex. Admin. 
Code section 3.37). Applicant

seeks exception to the DIS­
TANCE BETWEEN WELLS 
requ irem en t for the 
RECOMPLETION permit in 
Sec. 3, Bk. 32 T4N, T&P RR 
CO Survey, A-296, LUCK- 
POT (FUSSELMAN) Field, 
BORDEN County, being 9.5 
m iles SW d irec tion  from  
GAIL, Texas.

PU RSU A N T TO THE 
TERMS of Railroad Commis­
sioner rules and regulations, 
this application maybe granted 
WITHOUT A HEARING if 
no protest to the application is 
received within the deadline. 
An affected person is entitled 
to protest this application. Af­
fected persons include owners 
o f record and the operator or 
lessees of record o f adjacent 
tracts and tracts nearer to the 
proposed well than the mini­
mum lease line spacing dis­
tance. If  a hearing is called, the 
applicant has the burden to 
prove the need for exception. 
A Protestant should be pre­
pared to establish standing as 
an affected person, and to ap­
pear at the hearing either in 
person or by qualified repre­
sentative and protest the appli­
cation with cross-examination

or presentation of a direct case. 
The rules of procedure, please 
con tac t the C om m ission ’s 
Docket Services Department at 
(512)463-6848. I f  you have 
questions which are specific to 
the Application or the informa­
tion set forth in the Notice, 
p lease  con tac t the 
Commission’s Drilling Permit 
Unit at rule 37 (512) 463-6751.

IF YOU W ISH TO R E ­
QU EST A H EA RIN G  ON 
THIS APPLICATOIN AN IN­
TENT TO APPEAR IN PRO­
TEST M USHBERECEIVED 
IN THE RA ILRO A D  
C O M M ISSIO N ’S AU STIN 
OFFICE AT THE ADDRESS, 
FAX NUMBER, OR E-MAIL 
ADDRESS SET OUT ABOVE 
BY Nov. 5.2014 at 5:00 pm. IF 
NO PROTEST IS RECEIVED 
WITHIN SUCH TIME, YOU 
WILL LOSE YOUR RIGHT 
TO PROTEST AND THE RE­
QUESTED PERMIT MAY BE 
GRANTED ADM INISTRA­
TIVELY.

THIS NOTICE OF APPLI­
CATION REQUIRES PUBLI­
CATION

The location and identity of 
the well is as shown below: 

FIELD : LU CK -PO T
(FUSSELMAN)

L ease/U nit Nam e:
HUBBARD 3

Lease/Unit Well No.: 3 
Lease/Unit Acres: 654.7 
N earest Lease Line (ft):

1606.0
Nearest Well on Lease (ft):

1034.0
Lease Lines: 1668.0 F N L,

1606.0 O F  E L
Survey Lines: 1668.0 F N L ,

1606.0 O F  E L
As part of this application, 

applicant also seeks permit au­
thority in 1 additional field: (1) 
LU CK -PO T (CA N Y O N  
REEF). No rule exception is 
necessary pursuant to the field 
rules for this field.

Field Rules for ALL fields 
on the permit application are as 
follows:

L U C K - P O T 
(FUSSELMAN): OIL Special 
Rules 467/1200, 80.0 acres 

LU CK -PO T (CA N Y O N  
REEF): OIL Special Rules
467/1200, 80.0 acres

This well is to be drilled to 
an approximate depth of 10000 
feet.

If you have questions regard­
ing this application, please con­
tact the Applicant’s representa­
tive, Colleen Thacker, at (512) 
478-3456.

Join the Poka Lambro team  
for your technology needs!

High Speed Internet 
Local & Long Distance Phone 

Monitored Security & Automation 
Medical Emergency Alert 

Smart Solutions & Video Monitoring

innovative Technologies.... Unlimited Possibilities

806-924-7234 - v
806-561-560O Tahofca * 806-387-3331 Seagraves * 806-990-9901 Post

www.poka.com

mailto:SWR37@RRC.STATE.TX.US
http://www.poka.com
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[ We will seek to provide all reasonable accommodations for all persons with disabilities far any I 
Extension program. We request that you contact your Texas A&M AgriLife Extension Service j

office as soon as possible to advise i f  you require auxiliary aid.
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ijEXAS A&M 

EXTENSION

Wi> mil seek to pronti* ali reastmtrbk accommodationsfor ull per ­
sons m ih àìsaiàtitm fàc any Extension program, We reqitm  
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¿TEXAS A & M
m €~ O 1 I I C C

EXTENSION

You are Invited to join us on Tuesday« October 14th at 6:00 p.m. in the Borden County 
Event Center for a Fall program to help harvest tips and methods for organizing your life 

to enjoy more time with you family - from menu planning, grocery shopping, home 
management, time management and ways to enjoy quality time together.

Enjoy a sampling of a few simple recipes 
and make an easy take-home project (for even the least creative people).

Cost is $15 per person (will cover supplies and recipe/idea booklet).

Please RSVF by Friday, October 1 Oth (to allow for enough supplies) at 5:00 p.m. to 
(806)756-4336, via Facebook or julie.smith@agnet.tamu.edu

mailto:julie.smith@agnet.tamu.edu

