
I 1

11

The  ^ a n  Co-.

M r n n o u th  1 1 1 .

BAILEY COUNTY JOURNAL
‘77w» Community Of Opportunity-Where Water Makes the Difference’

Vol. 22. N"*r»ber 51 16 Pages Today Published Every Sunday at Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 79347 Sunday. December 16, 1984

*v»

i

h  <

i

I I

Numerous Wrecks 
Accompany Storm

A spectacular two vehicle 
accident at 10:06 p.m. Friday 
left a portion of Mul"shoe in 
darkness for some six hours.

Following a collision with a 
pickup in the 600 block of West 
American Boulevard, a large 
truck skidded out of control and 
overturned at Ladd Implement 
Co., wiping out electricity to a 
portion of Muleshoe for some
r ------
i
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iMuleshoe \
Funeral services for former 

longtime Muleshoe resident, 
Oberieta LeVaque, will be 
conducted at 1 p.m. tomorrow, 
Monday, at Ritch Funeral Home 
Chapel in Springfield, Colo.

She died Tuesday at Sun City, 
Ariz. where she resided with 
her husband, Wilbur.

He was formerly the manager 
of Production Credit Associa­
tion, and served at one time as 
the mayor of Muleshoe. She 
formerly was employed at John­
son Furniture Co.

Survivors include her hus­
band, Wilbur; a son, Martel of 
Amarillo; grandchildren and one
great-grandchildren.

***
Shawn Smith, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Jerry L. Smith of Laz- 
buddie, is among fifty-six 
students of West Texas State 
University, Canyon, to be ac­
cepted for membership into 
Alpha Chi, the national honor 
society, this semester.

He J&frrs the Texas Zeta 
chapter, which has existed on 
the WTSU campus since ten 
students were accepted as 
members in 1923.

Membership is limited to 
juniors and seniors whose 
grade-point averages are at 
least 3.50 of a possible 4.0 and 
who rank in the top ten percent 
of their classes. Alpha Chi has 
250 chapters in 44 states, all 
promoting academic excellence 
and exemplary character among
college students.

***
Airman Billy R. Scott, son of 

Henry and Mildred Scott of 
Sudan, has graduated from Air 
Force basic training at Lackland 
Air Force Base, Tx.

During the six weeks of 
training, the airman studied the 
Air Force mission, organization 
and customs and received

six hours. All of Muleshoe was 
out of electricity from 2:23 a.m. 
to 3:53 a.m. At 8 a .m ., 
workmen were still at the 
accident site attempting to set 
the truck upright and working 
on the power lines.

Shortly before 8 a.m., it was 
announced that electric power 
would be turned off for up to 
two hours while a power pole 
was replaced.

No one was injured in the 
accident on West American 
Blvd.

Nearly all Muleshoe City 
Police officers were at the 
accident site, along with the 
DPS, officers from the Bailey 
County Sheriffs office and the 
Muleshoe Fire Department.

Firemen set up their emer- 
ency vehicle and made coffee 
or the workers who spent the 

night at the accident, directing 
traffic to detour on West 
Avenue B and keeping the 
surprisingly large number of 
onlookers away from live wires 
which were left dangling follow­
ing the accident.

A rash of accidents on the 
highways around Muleshoe Fri­
day afternoon kept DPS Trooper 
Lacie Kirk, the local wrecker 
driver and the ambulance crews 
busy.

A woman and her small 
daughter were the first victims 
reported. The first accident was 
reported eight miles east of 
Muleshoe on Highway 70. The 
accident was a one vehicle 
rollover.

The woman was treated and 
released, but the small girl was 
hospitalized at W est Plains 
Medical Center.

Between 2:30-3 p .m ., an 
ambulance was sent to the 
intersection of FM746 and 
FM1731 where a woman was 
injured in a one vehicle rollover.

She was brought to Muleshoe 
for emergency treatment before 
being transferred to a hospital 
in Lubbock.

This was followed by an 
accident between 4:30-5 p.m.
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MULES IN  /4CT/ON--Showing they are as stubborn as the 
proverbial work mule, the Muleshoe Mules continue their winning 
ways in basketball, on their way to dumping Shallowater Tuesday 
night.

School Board Hears 
’ 84Athletic Report

During the regular monthly 
meeting of the board of trustees 
of the Muleshoe Independent 
School District Monday night, 
several informational reports 
were given, including a report 
on library circulation.

However, one of the major

Bovs” Cross Country and the 
very successful beginning of the 
1984-85 basketball season were 
indications of good examples.

There was a lengthy discus­
sion between trustees and 
Coach Williams on the level of 
participation. It was concluded

reports was probably the* that the over-all program is not
athletic report tor the 1984-85 J---- *----------------------------- -
school year. It was pointed out 
by Athletic Director, Windy 
Williams, that though the win- 
loss record for the varsity 
football team this year was not 
what was anticipated earlier in 
the year, the overall athletic 
program shows several
promising aspects.

He said the second place 
finish at the state competition in

Shoplifting Seminar 
Held Here Thursday

speical training 
lations.

In addition, 
complete basic 
credits toward 
degree through the Community 
~oll<

in human re­

airmen who 
training earn 
an associate

College of the Air Force.
He is a 1982 graduate 

Sudan High School.
of

A whopping 15 percent of the 
price you pay for an item has 
been ‘tacked on’ to take care of 
the cost of shoplifted items. 
This enlightening figure was 
released by Sgt. Wayne 
Holmes, of the Muleshoe City 
Police Department during shop­
lifting seminars conducted on 
Thursday.

“ Courteous, helpful, well- 
trained, watchful sales clerks 
are a businesses best bet in

preventing shoplifting,” said 
Sgt. Holmes, “ Shoplifters need 
privacy, and can’t operate if 
they are assisted by a good 
sales clerk.”

The sergeant told of a trio of 
shoplifters who were arrested in 
Muleshoe who had ‘shopping 
lists’ including what item they 
wanted, sizes, the value of the 
item, along with the re-sale 
price.

Each of the three women 
arrested wore two complete sets 
of underwear, he added, as this 
method was used apparently to 
be sure one set did not ’give 
way’ as they added their chosen 
items, without benefit of paying 
for them.

Another problem shoplifter is 
the ‘thrill’ stealer, who a lot of 
the time is a teenager, or 
younger person, who is dared 
by his peers, just to see if he or 
she can get away with it. “ They 
do not need the item, or items, 
but just want to see what they 
can get away with,” he added, 
“ and very often have enough 
money with them to pay for tne 
particular item they took several 
times over.”

The officer said the average 
theft is $15, but the fine for 
taking that $15 worth of 
merchandise is $200.
Con’t Page 6, Col. 4

DAYS 'TIL 
■CHRISTMAS'!

C1T'/ . COFC PRESENT SEM INAR- Muleshoe Police Sgt. Wayne 
Holmes, seated, and Toni Eagle, manager of the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and Agriculture, teamed up to present a 
shoplifting seminar in Muleshoe Thursday. Although small groups 
turned up for the two sessions, it was deemed highly successful in 
giving local k..crchants necessary information on shoplifting and 
potential shoplifters.

Rain, Sleet9 Snow 
Creating Hazards

down significantly from previous 
years precentagewise. The 161 
athletes currently enrolled in 
the program includes 38 percent 
of the student body. Also men­
tioned were several reasons 
contributing to the decrease in 
the number of young men in the 
football program.

Efforts to improve recruit­
ment and retention of athletes 
are currently being studied by 
the athletic director, coaching 
staff, and school board. The 
trustees expressed satisfaction 
with the over-all athletic report.

An attendance report was 
presented to the trustees show­
ing the average daily attendance 
for Muleshoe since 1968. Along 
with the report, the super­
intendent reported that the 
entire panhandle area of Texas 
has showed a decline in student 
population since 1968. It was 
pointed out that due to the 
increase in enrollment and due 
to the new method of calculat­
ing average daily attendance,
Con’t On Page 6, Col. 1

Bailey County 

Not Supporting 

The Red Cross
Because of major fire-related 

expenses in Muleshoe and slow 
public response, the Ameircan 
Red Cross is extending its 
fund-raising campaign in Bailey 
County.

Funds which are raised 
through private and business 
contrubutions will jgo to aid 
Bailey County military families 
and victims of fires and other 
disasters, explained Carl Hill of 
the South Plains Regional 
Chapter of the American Red 
Cross.

Red Cross sources note that 
during the year, the agency has 
provided over $1500 to Mule­
shoe fire victims. This money 
furnished cash vouchers for 
food, clothing, shelter and 
burial. The agency also notes 
that none of Bailey County’s 
Red Cross obligations have been 
met by Bailey County contribu­
tions.

Why don't you acquire a good 
feeling during this Christmas­
time, and contribute funds 
which will be used to help 
someone who has suffered a 
disaster in their lives? Send a 
contribution to the Red Cross.

Individuals wishing to aid the 
Red Cross are strongly encour­
aged to send their tax-deduct­
ible contributions to the 
American Red Cross, P.O. Box 
36, Muleshoe, Texas 79347.

It turned to full-fledged win­
ter in this area Friday, when 
light &'»in turned to sleet during 
the noon hour, causing a rash of 
accidents, and reducing the flow 
of traffic to first a crawl, then 
even further back to creeping.

By late afternoon Friday, an

No Objections 
, Are Registered 
For New Store

Very little comment has been 
received by Dave Marr, Mule-' 
shoe city manager, about the 
proposed new convenience store 
to be located at the Crossroads.

Giese Investment Co. of 
Clovis has asked the city for a 
letter of approval for the 
developers of the convenience 
store to purchase a portion of 
the land leased to the city by 
AT&SF Railway for the Mule 
Memorial location.

The city manager explained 
that as the city does not own 
the land where the Mule 
Memorial is located, the lease 
can be terminated by either 
party on 30 days written notice.

Also, the Mule Memorial 
would be located some 98 feet 
from the store building and 
slightly to the northwest as the 
company also plans to purchase 
an additional 50 feet to the 
north of the present service 
station building, as well as the 
50 feet to the east of the service 
station building.

Marr said the city cannot 
refuse to release the land to be 
sold for the store, but the 
investment company has asked 
for a letter from the city 
indicating their approval of the 
releasing of the land.

ice jlaze on streets and side­
walks had reduced motorized 
traffic, as well as foot ttaffic 
and person* who did not have to 
be out mostly stayed inside, 
while the sleet turned to freez­
ing rain.

Anyone who had a vehicle 
parked outside had to spend 
some time scraping the nearly 
one-quarter inch layer of ice 
from windows before the vehicle 
could be moved.

Saturday morning, more rain, 
freezing rain, sleet and snow 
had been forecast for the entire 
area.

Very cold temperatures also 
accompanied the storm on 
Friday, although streets were 
beginning to thaw by Saturday 
morning as warmer weather was 
moving in.

National WeathervService said 
there was little clrance for an 
accumulation of snow, although 
both snow and freezing rain 
were staying in the forecast 
through Sunday.

Light snow fell throughout the 
night on Friday in far west 
Texas, including El Paso, and 
blowing snow was creating driv-

of Newin mdsting hazards 
Mexico.

Thursday night, snow packed 
streets in and around Clovis and 
schools did not open for Friday 
in that city some 30 miles to the 
west of Muleshoe.

Warmer weather was in the 
forecast for Sunday afternoon 
and Monday, with wet, winter 
weather again in the forecast for 
Tuesday and Wednesday of this 
week, according to the National 
Weather Service.

Travelers warnings, and haz­
ardous driving conditions were 
being given.

Shortly before 8:30 a.m. 
Saturday, heavy snow started 
falling in Muleshoe.

Hospital Will Sign New Lease
Robert Haralson, administra­

tor at West Plains Medical 
Center, called a ‘press confer­
ence’ for 2 p.m. Wednesday 
afternoon, however, the confer­
ence was cancelled during the

Solar Power
Irrigation
Introduced

Patricia and Robert Bruno of 
P&R Surge Systems, Inc., of 
Lubbock, were in Muleshoe 
Monday evening to introduce 
their newest surge irrigation 
system to current users.

They were introducing a solar 
powered surge unit, program­
mable, and designed to replace 
the battery operated units now 
in use.

Arnold Price of Pivot 
Products, explained to the 
group at K-Bob’s Steak House, 
“ What farmers are doing is 
mining water. We are constant­
ly looking at ways to boost 
water efficiency and cut power 
costs.

"With our new system, open 
ditches, which formerly lost one 
half of the water in the ditch 
before it gets to the row, are 
replaced by gated pipe or 
underground tile.

“ Surge irrigation allows a 
farmer to put on a little less 
water, and put that water on 
more economically, as well as 
more uniformly. We have found 
in most instances that we can

[jroduce more in the same 
ength of time, and cover more 

land, without tailwater,” he 
added.

Robert Bruno told the group 
of farmers, and soil specialists, 
that P&R first produced a surge 
unit with two programs, and 
now, they have come up with 
the solar powered unit, which 
will operate perpetually on three 
hours or less of sunshine per 
day.

This will help eliminate ex­
pensive battery replacement, he 
added.

The developers also said the 
new unit does not make existing 
units obsolete, as it is designed 
to be interchangeable, either
Con’t Page 6. Col. 3

noon hour the same day.
He said at around 10:30 a.m. 

Wednesday, that the signing of 
a contract by the board of 
directors of WPMC and West- 
world Community Health Care 
of Lake Forest, Calif, was 
imminent.

However, it was reported by 
noon that a ‘technicality’ pre­
vented the immediate signing of 
the 30 year contract, although it 
was expected to be signed 
within days.

Wednesday morning, the 
story below was in the Lubbock 
Avalanche-Journal morning edi­
tion:

“The borad of directors of 
West Plains Medical Center and 
Southern California hospital 
management company speciali­
zing in rural hospitals are 
expected to sign a management 
lease agreement today.

“ Hospital Administrator Bob 
Haralson said the board is 
involved in final negotiations 
with Westworld Community 
Health Care of Lake Forest, 
Calif., for a 30-year lease that 
would allow the company to 
take financial responsibility for 
the medical center while retiring 
the hospital's debt through 
lease payments. Westworld 
would receive all profits from 
the services offered by the 
hospital.

“ Richard Barnett, vice presi­
dent for development for West- 
world, said the agreement is 
expected to be executed today. 
The hospital board will still 
have to approve the contract.

“ I don't see any reason why 
it won’t be executed,” said 
Barnett. If the agreement is 
signed, Barnett said his com­
pany would begin an interim 
management relationship with 
the hospital Jan. 1, 1985. The 
30-year lease would go into 
effect June 1. 1985.

“ Haralson said West Plains 
Medical Center has been finan­
cially troubled for quite some 
time and has failed to show a 

rofit recently. He said the 
oard felt the hospital “ had 

reached a point to where we 
had to have some kind of 
outside assistance.”

“ Haralson said the board 
examined 15 hospital manage­
ment companies before select-

l

mg Westviorld. He said the

Con’t Page 6. Col. 3
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Poly Filled & Down Ski Look

Heavy Winter Coats

Jogging Suits

Albertson ’s Shop For Men
272-3000
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tcro one

Mrs. Davis Named 
Extension
Homemaker Of Year

STUDENTS PRESENT PROGRAM-Jetuier Taylor, Misty Richardson. Nicole Wilterding, Bryan Field. 
Jodie Foster, Francisco Torres, Stephanie Perez, Violet Mendoza, Julie Gilliland, Cheree Copley and 
Crista Trussell, will all be performing in the Christmas program Wednesday, Dec. 19 at 2 p.m.

CQtidaQ Shorn 9fotes (jUiss Janet cAl&
A bridal shower honoring 

Janet Nix, bride elect of Clifford 
Watson, was held Saturday, 
Dec. 1 in the home of Mrs. Joe^ 
Ellison.

The serving table was covered 
with an ecru lace cloth and 
accented with candles centered 
in a grapevine wreath in mauve 
and pinks, the bride elects 
chosen colors.

Coffee, punch, cookies, nuts 
and mints were served froi i 
crystal appointments by Paul.- 
and Lee Anne Ellison. Jeannia 
and Melissa Nix, sisters of the 
honoree, assisted in opening 
and recording of the gifts.

Special guests included- Mrs. 
Shawni Nix of Sudan, mother 
of the bride elect; Mrs. Pat 
Watson of Muleshoe, mother 
of the prospective groom; Mrs. 
Olin Nix, grandmother of the 
bride elect; and two aunts, Pam 
Humphreys and Ann Gaston, all 
of Sudan.

The hostesses gift was a set 
of farbeware cookware. Hostess­
es for the occasion included: 
Mrs. James Clay, Mrs. Calvin 
Vernon, Mrs. Mike Nix, Mrs. 
Joe Ellison, Mrs. Joe Bellar, 
Mrs. Carl Peck, Mrs. Bob

Qtna ‘tXu&ns, Qipeon

Syekmge 

oMawiage Qiows
Ivan Gipson and Gina Kulms 

were united in marriage in a 
private ceremony held in the 
First Baptist Church in Spade at 
2 p.m. Saturday, Dec. 1. Rev. 
James Brennon read the mar­
riage vows.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam DeLaRiva of 
Sudan and Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Kulms of Anton.

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride chose a chapel 
length gown of white lace and 
wore a Fingertip white veil and 
carried a bouquet of blue and 
white carnations.

Sandra Kulms, sister of the 
bride, served as maid of honor 
and was dressed in a light blue 
dress and carried a nosegay of 
blue and white carnations. 
Misty Parker was bridesmaid.

Teddy Whitefield of Anton 
served as best man.

Following the ceremony, a 
reception was held in the 
fellowship hall of the church. A 
white sheet cake, baked and 
decorated by Mary Powell was 
decorated in blue and white. 
The cake, punch, coffee and 
mints were served from crystal 
appointments.

Taylor, Mrs. Joe Markham, 
Mrs. A1 Harrison, Mrs. Gail 
Messamore, Mrs. Bob Summer, 
Mrs. Dan Wood, Mrs. Tommy 
Moss, Mrs. Haldon Messamore, 
Mrs. Cliff Houghton, Mrs.

James Gore, Mrs. Matt Nix, 
Mrs. Cliff Mardis, Mrs. 
Raymond Harper, Mrs. Lance 
Broadhurst, Mrs. Glen 
Cardwell, Mrs. Richard Black 
and Mrs. John Burk.

Mrs. Fern Davis was named 
1984 Extension Homemaker of 
the Year and was presented a 
plaque at the Bailey County
Council luncheon Wednesday,
Dec. 12.

She has been active in club 
work for 50 years in Bailey 
County and is a charter mem­
ber. She has held all offices in 
the club and council. TEHA 
(Texas Extension Homemakers 
Association) chairman three 
times which includes the last 
two years.

Extension Homemaker of the 
Year award is won on the point 
system. Members receive points 
for attending meetings, working 
as committee person, p;ving 
programs and attending Exten­
sion related programs. Mrs. 
Davis has attended district 
training meetings as well as 
serving as chairman of exhibits 
and Education and Expansion 
Committee.

Officers for 1985, were also 
installed, they include: Jackie 
Blaylock, chairman; Lucille 
Gross, vice chairman: Linda 
Huckaby, secretary/treasurer; 
TEHA chairman, Helen 
Redwine; program chairman, 
Lucille Gross; EEE chairman, 
Fern Davis; finance chairman, 
Linda Huckaby; recreation 
chairman, Alice Moore; 4-H 
chairman, Rose Sain; and tele­
phone chairman, Loraine
Dearing.

HOMEMAKER OF THE YEAR -M rs. Fern Davis, on left, was 
named 1984 Extension Homemaker of the year at the Bailey 
County Council lunchoen Wednesday. Making the presentation is 
Deana Finke.

Piano Pupils Present Christmas Program

• *  *  •

Every in d iv id u a l 
owes society more than 
can be repaid in one 
lifetime.

* * * *
You can never tell, 

from the way a woman 
smiles at you, what she 
is thinking of you.

The piano pupils of Elaine 
Damron were presented in two 
Christmas programs Tuesday 
evening, Dec. 11 in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Doyce Turner. 
Immediate families and grand­
parents were guests. Christmas 
niano solos and duets were used
on the programs.

On the first program the 
following pupils played: April 
Hugg, Julie Crittenden

McElroy, Michelle Finney,
Stacy McElroy, Dayna
Hamilton, Selina Gonzales, Lisa 
Hamiton, Alan Finney, Gilrobert 
Rennels, Lisa McElroy, and 
Beth Funk.

Refreshments were served by 
Mrs. Gary Hugg, Mrs. Don
McElroy, Mrs. Charles
Hamilton and Mrs. Robert 
Finney.

Playing on the second pro­
gram were D’Anne Box, 
Lashelle Scoggin, Holly Hutton, 
Kelly Conklin, Corley Hutton, 
Ken Craft, Lori Williams, Angie 
King, Heather Hutton, Jeanne 
Cox, Mason Conklin, Amy 
Turner and Jeremy Bruns.

Mothers serving punch and 
cookies were Mrs. Terry 
Hutton, Mrs. Norris Conklin, 
Mrs. Jimmy Craft and Mrs. 
Edwin Cox.

(2f/E£W--Antonia Marufo,
daughter of Pedro Eva Marufo, 
was crowned Queen of the 12 of 
December for the celebration of 
Our Lady Guadalupe, presented 
by the Guadalupanes of the 
Immaculate Conception Catholic 

»Church of Muleshoe.
'jf- . .. , t a

PRINCESS- Norma Diaz,
daughter of Melton and Maria 
Elena Diaz, was named princess 
of the 12 of December for the 
celebration of Our Lady of 
Guadalupe presented by the 
Guadalupanes of the 
Immaculate Catholic Church of 
Muleshoe.

The Friendship Club met for 
their annual Red Dress Party 
and Christmas Dinner, which 
was served bv Karen St. Clair.

The program was given by 
Lois Witherspoon. Those attend­
ing were: Katherin Cole, 
Sammie Moore, and her son 
Don Moore, Mr. and Mrs. O.D. 
Ray, Mr. and Mrs. Webb 
Watts, Mr. and Mrs. Wilson 
Witherspoon, Ruth Shafer and 
her daughter Morna Beth, Mrs. 
Swafford, Sena Stevens and 
Sammie Ethridge.

Each one took a gift to 
exchange.

Muleshoe TOPS Club chapter 
#34 met at 6:30 p.m. Thursday, 
Dec. 6 in the meeting room of 
Bailey County Electric with 
Clara Lou Jones, leader, in 
charge.

The TOPS pledge was recited 
and the fellowship song sung. 
Laverne James, weight record­
er, called the roll with eight 
members present. Minutes of 
the previous meeting were read 
and approved.

It was decided that the group 
would weigh in only (from 5 to 
5:30 p.m.) Thursday, Dec. 20.

Rose Sain was named best 
loser for the week. Ruth 
Clements and Evelene Harris 
tied for first runner up.

Best loser for the month was 
Evelene Harris. First runner up 
was Ruth Clements and Clara 
Lou Jones was second runner. 
KOPS queen was Nan Gatlin.

The meeting was closed with 
the singing of the goodnight 
song.

BETTER VISION
ATLANTA -- Controversial sur­

gery to improve vision with a star- 
burst of cuts in the cornea reduced 
nearsightedness in every one of 435 
patients studied with no serious side 
effects, according to a study released 
recently.

Christmas

Gift Wrap
lOSq.Ft. Foil 
30 Sq. Ft. Paper

New Hours:
8  a.iii. - 6 pan.

Call Sherri, Josie, Julie, Helen, 
or Bernice for an appointment Today!

Main Street Beauty 
Salon

115 Main 272-3448;

STORE 
HOURS:

8:00 a.m. -8:00 p.m?
Sunday f  

1:00 p .m .-6:00 p .m j

Life Savers ^
Candy %

10 Roll Box T
Reg. 1.99

R e m e m b e r

12 Count Box

|  Candy Canes
jjf Reg. 1.49

Brock
Chocolate
Cherries

Old Spice

I  After Shave
H  Reg. 3.49

Nylint All Metal Reg. 26.88
Golden Eagle -

118-Wheeler$ 1 5 ® ®
Entire Stock Monkeys Gremlins 

£  P l u s h  T O Y S * 1"* Many Mere
a; Teddy Bears ‘ OCT <7/

U n i c o r n ^ G a r f i e l c ^ ^ ^ ^ i ^ ^ ^ ^ O f f l

S  lM n c ^ ^ ^ ^ k ^ W e t ^ W a lh a W e l
g Baby Doll * ^  A A,
*  k. , . ™ * 6 4 4 1

Michael Jackson l™ " 8™* YouT| # Voice Througl
Electronic ^  R«dk

6  ̂Wheeler
[idem
To

Reg. $  
13.88 1088!

^  25 Count

@ Christmas

Cosmo

Stereo System
AM/FM - MPX Radio 

Cassette Recorder/Player 
With Detachable Speakers

$ 7 7 8 8

Boxed Box of Box of
{Christmas n „ 20Reg. 2.29 Reg. 3.:
I Cards $̂ 88 $26^

Cosmo
Stereo System

AM/FM MPX Radio 
( assette Recorder/ 
Player Detachable 

Speakers With Separate 
Woofers And Tweeters

*117*8

9

«

4

*

4

f

I

*

(
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The Girls At Chubbys

Will Come Early & Stay Late 

Tues,Dec, 18

For Those People Who Cannot 

Come During Regular Business Hours!

Chubbys Beauty Shop
214 W. 2nd 272-3976

Mrs. Carpenter 
Selected

CHRISTMAS r/ME--Second grade pupils at Dillman Elementary School will present a Christmas 
program for their parents Wednesday, Dec. 19, at 2 p.m. Some of the performers are (L-R) back row: 
Todd Shipman, Angie Bean, Jason Barrett, Moses Pedroza, Oscar Olivas and Heath Eagle; front row; 
Josh Lindt, Sean Flanary and Genny Eggers.

Easy To Make Christmas Ornaments
One of the nicest Christmas 

traditions of days gone by was 
decking the halls with home­
made treats. Family and friends 
would roll out cookie dough, 
shape into angels, stars and 
trees, make colorful icings and 
sprinkle sparkling decorations 
on the fresh baked sugar 

, cookies. Then, use it all to trim 
everything from trees to 
wreaths.

Festive and enjoyable, these 
edible ornaments are easier to 
make than you think. Dazzling 
stars, heavenly angels, adorable 
gingerbread men, bells, trees, 
wreaths and candy canes quick­
ly create a festive flavor. 
They’re easy to cut out and all 

k you need for decorating is a 
little imagination and some 

• children who will love to join in 
the fun.

For friends far away, don’t 
forget to send a box of those 
sugar cookies packing. What 
a wonderful way to say “ Wish 
you were here,” and what a 
delicious surprise to receive.

This Christmas, holiday cheer 
and warmth and goodness can 
begin in your kitchen with 
Christmas Sugar Cookies. Any 
way you slice them, or shape 
them or frost them, they’re 
treats. This recipe will please 
your family and friends, so put 
it in a safe place. 01’ St. Nick

Sudan 
Cub Scouts 
Met Tuesday

The Sudan Cub Scouts met 
Tuesday afternoon in the scout 
room of the Sudan Community 
Center with four members and 
their sponsors present.

The boys learned the meaning 
of the Cub Scout promise and 
the Law of the Pack. They 

i studied about the founder of the 
Scouts, and that he based his 
principles on the Bible about 
being kind and thoughtful to 
others and not being selfish.

Brownies were served to 
those attending, who included: 
Michael Phillips, Grant Gate- 
wood, Lesley Weber, Alan Black 
and sponsors, Mr. and Mrs. 
Alan Black and Dorman Walser.

Three-Way
News

by

Mrs. H.W. Garvin
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may leave you a note and ask 
for another heaping batch next 
year!

Christmas Sugar Cookies 
2 cups sifted all purpose flour 
1 teaspoon baking powder 
Vi teaspoon salt 
Vi cup shortening 
1 cup granulated sugar 
1 egg
V* cup milk
‘/j teaspoon lemon extract

Sift together the flour, baking 
powder and salt; set aside. In a 
mixing bowl blend the shorten­
ing and granulated sugar and 
mix in the egg. Add dry 
ingredients alternately with milk 
and lemon extract and blend 
thoroughly. Chill dough over­
night.

Preheat oven to 400° F. Roll 
dough to Vi” thickness on 
floured pastry cloth. Cut out 
shapes with knife or cookie 
cutters. Transfer to greased

cookie sheet and bake 7 to 10 
minutes. Yields about 4 dozen 
cookies.

Decorating and Icing 
3% cups Powdered Sugar (1-lb 
carton)
4 tablespoons milk (approx.) 
Food colorings

Combine powdered sugar 
with milk; stir until smooth. 
Add more milk. 1 teaspoon at a 
time, to achieve desired spread­
ing consistency. Divide icing 
into several small bowls and tint 
with several drops of food 
coloring. Trim with colored 
decorator sprinkles, cinnamon 
red hots and candies.

Additional copies of the 
recipe and information about 
other free recipes and free 
cookbooks are abvailable from 
Imperial Sugar Company, P .0  
Box 500, Sugar Land, Texas 
77478.

Sudan Young Homemakers Has Party

Farmers in the Comunity are 
very busy with harvest. All gins 
m the comunity are very busy.

Rev. Robert Edwards brought 
both morning and evening 
messages at the Three Way 
Baptist Church Sunday The 
Edwards live at Sundown.

The Sudan Young Home­
makers held their Christmas 
party Saturday, Dec. 1. Follow­
ing a meal at K-Bob’s in 
Muleshoe, the group returned 
to the community room at the 
First National Bank in Sudan for 
gift exchanging and desserts.

Those attending were Tom 
and Julie Rigsby, Dvke and Ann 
Gaston, Deanna Humphreys, 
Dorman and Lisa Walser, Gery 
and Susan Donnell, Larry and 
Mary Kay Baker, Terry and 
Jodee Tennyson, Rita Conley, 
Mike and Doneece McDonald, 
Cindy Wiseman and David and 
Margaret Williams.

The regular monthly meeting 
of the Sudan Young Home­
makers was held Monday, Dec. 
3 at the community room. The 
program which was open to the 
public, was presented by 
Christye Waters from SPS and 
Emily Cauhape from Energas. 
Holiday foods and crafts were 
the topic of the program.

Following the program, a 
short business meeting was 
held. Plans were made for the 
clubs participation in the Toys 
and Tots program.

It was voted to construct a 
club sign to be placed on the 
welcome sign the FFA boys will 
be making.

Guests present for the holiday 
program were Angie Carson, 
Martha Markham, Patty and 
Misty Miller, Laren Bruggeman, 
Shirley Martin, Elsie Seymore, 
Linda Summer, Sandra Franks, 
Ramond Engram, Carrol Heck­
man and others.

Members present included: 
Margaret Williams, Lisa

Walser, Mechele Edwards, 
Deanna Humphreys, Ann 
Gaston, Deneece McDonald, 
Ginger Ritchey, Rita Conley, 
Ann Carson, June Pierce, Julie 
Rigsby, Cindy Wiseman, Debbie 
Phillips and Jodee Tennyson.

Artist Of Month
Mrs. Barbara Carpenter of 

Littlefield has been selected as 
December Artist of the Month 
at the Muleshoe Public Library. 
Mrs. Carpenter had lived in 
Bailey County most of her life 
before moving to Littlefield two 
and half years ago.

She is a member of the 
Muleshoe Art Association and 
the Littlefield First Baptist 
Church.

She has painted a number of 
years. She began in oils with 
Frances Stegall. She has also 
painted with Blanche Lender- 
son, LaWanda Calton, Jean 
Green, Carolyn Walker and 
Harold Scott.

Other medias she has studied 
include water color with Danny 
Gamble and E.A. Herring, and

Gstels with Vera Griffin and 
ae Carou. She has entered 

some of her paintings in several 
shows, winning third place 
honors in all three medias and a 
number of honorable mention 
awards in Muleshoe, Plainview 
and Clovis, N.M.

Currently she has paintings 
hanging at Muleshoe Animal 
Clinic, K-Bob’s in Muleshoe, 
Paint-n-Place and Triangle 
Indian Shop in Clovis, N.M.

She and her husband, 
Donnie, have three children, 
Lynn of A bilene, Susie of 
Farwell and Angila of Little­
field.

The Muleshoe Rebekah Lodge 
met Tuesday night with Sandi 
Robinson, Noble Grand, in 
charge. Ina Wilemon, chaplin, 
gave the opening prayer. Min­
utes of the previous meeting 
were read by Fern Davis, 
secretary.

The first business of the 
evening was the election of 
officers. Thursie Reid was 
elected Noble Grand for the 
1985, term and Ruby Green was 
elected vice grand.

Other officers elected were 
Fern Davis, secretary; Ina 
Wilemon, treasurer; representa­
tive, Dodie Actkinson; Patsy 
Chance, alternate; and Joyler.e 
Costen, team captain.

Plans were finalized for the 
upcoming Christmas party to be 
held next Tuesday night, Dec. 
18. Turkey and dressing and all 
the trimmings will be served to 
Rebekahs and their families. 
Members and each family 
member is ask to take a gift to 
be exchanged. Christmas carrols 
will be sung.

Lena Hawkins gave the 
closing prayer. Fourteen mem­
bers attended.

BARBARA CARPENTER

Birthday Party Honors Casie,Cortney Legg
A combined birthday party 

held at Show Biz Pizza Place in 
Lubbock Tuesday, Dec. 4 honor­
ed Courtney and Casie Legg on 
their fourth and first birthdays.

Following games, the group 
were served birthday cake and 
pizza and they visited with 
“ Billy Bob.”

Attending were Amanda Pick- 
rell Kyla Morris, Garrett and 
Tiffany Flowers, T.J. Ingle, 
Jennifer, Candace and 
Stephanie Lynn, Kelsey and

Shannon Swart, Lauren Ray, 
Dustin and D.J. Provence, 
Heather, Justin and Amber 
Legg, and Kristen Baker.

Grandparents attending in­
cluded: Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Moss pf Sudan and Mrs. Teresa 
Baccus of Lubbock.

Others attending were 
Rhonda Pickrell, Pam Morris, 
Kelli Flowers, Phyliss Lynn, 
Deanna Swart, Loretta Ray, 
Mary Baker, Tracey Provence 
and Nancy Legg.

Candice Michelle Bowling
Dr. and Mrs. Rod A. Bowling 

of Fort Collins, Colo, are the 
proud parents of a daughter, 
Candice M ichelle, born on 
Friday, Nov. 30.

Candice weighed eight 
unds and 12 ounces and was 

0 inches long. She has three 
plder brothers, Bo, who is 
seven; Jamey, five; and Mitch, 
three years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Bowling of Sudan 
and Mr. and Mrs. C.L. Bagley 
of Marfa, Texas.

Customer Appreciation Night 
Monday 12-17-84

6:00 P.M.
TO

9:00 P.M.
(Three Hours Only)

Save

ANY REGULAR PRICE ITEM IN THE STORE. 
Add An Additional 15% off Any YELLOW

TAGGED ITEM. We Will Close From 5:00 P.M . 
To 6:00 P.M. And Reopen At 6:00 P.M. For 
This Event.

jnday 1 to 6 321 South Main

NlTlHlOlNlY



cu rb

Fry & Cox, Inc. Will Close Sat, Dec. 22 At 9 p 
& Will Reopen Thurs. Dec. 27 At 8 Care Bear Poseable Semi-Truck

■m  R p n  +  a  M 0*  Deliver a heavy load of Iriaures r ik  paint and m°re in ,h
*  4.2V w  wheeler. Steel frame i

Charmkins

Stanley SteelAll Christmas

Tree lights
Red Togged

Hoover

Helpmate w/Free Handle
Lots of stocking stuffers, small appliances, 

personel appliances, tools, gloves, telephones 
and Sharp Calculators

Tree Toppers
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Arnold Price, Patricia Bruno and Robert Bruno

Board,.
Ton’t From Page 1

Muleshoe shows an increase in 
attendance for the first time 
since 1981. The average daily 
attendance for 1984-85 will be at 
least 1,606 as compared to 1,633 
in 1975-76 school yecr.

In business action, the 
trustees approved a request 
from the band directors 
(Anthony Gibson and Martha 
Anthis) to take the Mighty “ M” 
Band to the Carlsbad Spring 
Festival on May 3-5 1985. It 
was noted that the band 
members would not miss any 
school as May 3 is a teacher 
in-service day, and the band 
members have already raised 
the funds necessary to fund the 
trip.

A tax collection report was 
given, as well as a financial 
report.

Following an executive ses­
sion, the trustees accepted the 
resignation of Nita Burreson as

Irrigation...
Con’t From Page 1
partially or totally.

Various timed cycles are 
available on the new surge 
power unit, said Bruno, as he 
explained how the system op­
erates.

He said the unit is pro­
grammed, and breaks into 
cycles, choosing the cycles, with 
four programs available.

“ Last year’s unit was smart, 
but it took a lot of energy to 
operate,” said Bruno. “ The 
new unit will cut energy 
consumption to one-twentieth of 
last year’s cost. The self- 
perpetuating solar panel will 
keep the unit going indefinitely. 
A battery will last approximate­
ly two weeks in a unit without 
the solar panel, while three 
hours of sunshine will keep the 
new unit fully charged.”

The P&R Surge System op­
erator also explained that re­
conditioned units will be avail­
able.

In a time when energy costs 
are high, and water is being 
depleted and not replaced, the 
new solar powered units are 
expected to be a boon to the 
area farmers and ranchers, 
according to the developers.

Hospital.

librarian of DeShazo element­
ary. Mrs. Burreson will be 
moving to Brownfield with her 
family.

In the superintendent’s report 
on correspondence and school 
and community events, the 
superintendent shared corre­
spondence and news paper 
photographs showing that the 
old Muleshoe High School band 
uniforms are bing used by the 
Technical High School of 
Matamora, Mexico for the first 
bme. They were worn during 
the 74th Anniversary celebration 
of the Mexican Revolution, and 
a letter of appreciation was sent 
to the superintendent.

HEALTH CARE
Americans’ health care 

bill rose 10.3 percent to 
$355 billion in 1983, the 
lowest annual increase in a 
decade, but health 
spending claimed 10.8 per­
cent of the gross national 
product, the largest share 
ever'

—  Convenience *
« Vs* * *

. . 5 to re  .

t • ■
*•■•**" ' ____

c u r b

Mule

HIGHWAY 84

PROPOSED CONVENIENCE-I f  Santa Fe Railway approves the sale of property to an investment 
firm, this will be the new convenience store, to be located at the Crossroads in Muleshoe. It is noted 
that a north curb would separate the store from the railroad, the there will be two west entrances, 
along with a south entrance, and direct access from the Mule Memorial. If approved, the store 
construction is expected to start in the near future.

Con’t From Page 1 
company was selected because 
it specializes in smaller hospi­
tals.

“ Westworld owns three hosp­
itals and has management 
leases with 19 other medical 
facilities in 11 states The 
company owns a hospital in 
Wortham and manages a medi­
cal facility in Hubbard.

“ Barnett said Westworld will 
assume total financial repson- 
sibility for the medical center 
including the replacement of 
equipment, remodling, and 
other services. He said the 
company will work with the 
existing hospital employees.

“ We’re also planning to de­
velopment some new programs 
and services to add new blood 
to the hospital,” said Barnett. 
He said satellite clinics in local 
communities are being consider­
ed.

“ Barnett said Westworld is 
hoping to make the medical 
facility show a profit through 
upgrading services and adding 
the satellite clinics.”

God has given you one face, and 
you make yourself another.

-Shakespeare.

Seminar •••
Con’t From Page 1

Sgt. Holmes told the business 
people what to particularly 
watch for in attempting to spot 
potential shoplifters, and meth­
ods shoplifters use, including 
professional shoplifters.

He said the prime time for 
shoplifting is noon, when the 
sales force at a store has been 
reduced due to lunch hours, and 
immediately after school in the 
afternoon.

If a clerk spots a shoplifter, 
he suggests letting them get 
outside the store before ap­
proaching them, also, if they do 
get into a vehicle to leave, have 
as accurate as possible descrip­
tion of the suspected shoplifter, 
as well as the license number, 
and especially, the color, of the 
vehicle they leave the premises 
in.

Although attendance at the 
two seminars conducted Thurs­
day was small, Sgt. Holmes and 
Toni Eagle, manager of the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture said they 
wished to especially thank the 
businesses represented.

Annexation, New Store On City Agenda
The Muleshoe City Council 

will be meeting at 8:30 a.m. on 
Tuesday, December 18 in the 
council meeting room at the city 
hall.

One item of business will be 
the consideration and discussion 
of an ordiance providing for the 
extension of certain boundary 
limits of the city of Muleshoe 
and the annexation of certain 
territory consisting of 88.75 
acres of Bind, which territory

lies adjacent to and adjoins the 
present boundary limits of the 
City of Muleshoe.

Also, the council will consider 
and discuss a “ request for a 
letter of approval from the City 
of Muleshoe for the purchase of 
property leased to the City of 
M uleshoe by the Atchison, 
Topeka and Santa Fe Railway.”

Also on the agenda will be 
the consideration and discussion 
of depository bids.

*■ Af-M
NEW STORE HOURS

|7:30 A.M. till 7:30 PM,\
M O N D A Y

T H R O U G H  S A T U R D A Y

MyUttle
Pony™

Reg. 4.99

My Little Pony

Waterfall
Reg.

17.98 * 1 3 *
Concept Two™ 
Upright Vacuum

3301
$ 2 9 9 9 5

3303

$279*
Christmas Paper

Reg. 2.09 77* or 3 Rolls

Reg. 2.99 or 3 Rolls *4"
2 Roll Pack w/Ribbon Reg. 4.98 $33 *  

______________________ 2 Packages $ 5 «

169”
Grillmaster 1
Dual burners provide 361-sq. in. cooking 
surface. Has redwood side tables, shelf, 
front table. 20-lb. LP cylinder._______ 3174T

Harvard
C U T L E R Y

5-Pc. Cutlery Set
Quality sat incl. Bench cook’s, 
paring, boning and slicing knives 
in wood slant block. 276

Leather

Log Carriers
Procter-Silex

Electric Juicer 2W $14"
Presto Electric

KnffetSRcer
Reg

54.99

Cabbage Patch Kids

Crawling Babies
Reg $ 1 9 9
2.99 I

Stomper

4X4 Reg
6.99

True Value

Pick-ups
Duncan

Big Rig Reg
8.88

Polished 11 Piece

Ranch Tool Set
S, *19"

2 Pc. Set

Vice Grip

*14”
Reg

21.49

Sharp

Microwave
Ovens

Models
R9524& R8310

MOO00
Singer

Off

i-Me-Quick *1
Reg 29.95

Hunter

Ceiling Fan
D uraC rafM C r"-

Table Sow
Python Rope

J3 *7"

Reg
179.99 * 8 9 »

$ 5 «

W eAjgoHgyeGiftCertificates
We Will Gift Wrap Your h ln . | , . ! 7

Fry & Cox, Inc.
4 0 1 S. 1st. 2 7 2 -4 * 1 1
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PRIZES AWARDED B Y  TOWN AND COUNTRY-F.L. Steve
Stephens, president of Town & Country Food Stores, and Walt 
Matzek, marketing director, draw from the approximately 112,000 
registrants for 104 prizes in their 100th store promotion. The grand 
prize, a Honda ATC 110 three wheel motorcycle, was won by Lisa 
Blatchford of Big Spring. Muleshoe winners included Stacy Stroud, 
a Marlboro bag and Lydia Wright, one case of motor oil.

SO U TH W EST E X P R E S S -P ovuU t musical group from the 
Olton-Plainview area, were the featured entertainment Friday for 
the Mulehsoe State Bank’s Christmas party. Members of the 
group are from top left, Lonnie Venable, David Finke, Marir** 
riodges,~3fennie ty n n  Hodges, Richard Edwards and George 
Jones.

Dec. 17-20-1984 
BREAKFAST 

MONDAY
Milk, Cereal, Toast, Fruit 

TUESDAY
Milk, Toast, Jelly, Sausage, 

Fruit
WEDNESDAY 

Milk, Honev Buns, Juice

Vivian V. Ward

THURSDAY
Milk. Toast, Cooked Cereal, 

Fruit
FRIDAY 

NO SCHOOL 
LUNCH 

MONDAY
Milk, Bar*B*Que Franks, 

Blackeyed Peas, Whole Pota­
toes, Corn Bread, Fruit 

TUESDAY
Milk, Muleburgers, Lettuce & 

Tomato, Pickles & Onions, 
Tater Tots, Cookies

WEDNESDAY
Milk, Enchallada Casserole, 

Beans, Corn, Corn Bread, Fruit 
THURSDAY

Funeral Services Milk, Sandwiches, Potato 
Salad, Pork & Beans, Cake

Pending FRIDAY 
NO SCHOOL

Funeral services for Vivian V. 
Ward, 84, are pending with 
Ellis Funeral Home. Mrs. Ward 
died Thursday in the Com­
munity Hospital in Reverside, 
Calif.

A native of Jack County, 
Texas, Mrs. Ward was born 
June 10, 1900, and moved to 
Bailey County in 1924, from 
Hugo, Okla. She was housewife 
and a Baptist. She married 
Arthur Edmond Ward Oct. 15, 
1919, in Jack County, Texas. He 
died July 25, 1974.

Survivors include tow sons, 
Cleo Ward of Muleshoe, and 
Dudley Ward of Hobbs, N.M.; 
five daughters, Mrs. Edna 
Harner and Mrs. Hazel Carter, 
both of Lubbock, Mrs. LaTrice 
Garth of Dumas, Mrs. Roxie 
Dorsey of Hesperia, Calif, and 
Mrs. Helen Vinson of Riverside, 
Calif.; one sister, Mrs. Oleta 
Ballard of Jacksboro; two 
brothers, Bentley Eason and 
Guy Eason, both of Riverside, 
Calif.; 25 grandchildren; and 
several great grandchildren.

Muleshoe schools 
Combo Line 
MONDAY

Milk or Tea, Pizza, Buttered 
Mixed Vegetables, Pickles, 
Fruit

TUESDAY
Milk or Tea, Muleburgers, 

Lettuce & Tomato, Pickles & 
Onions, Tater Tots, Cookies 

WEDNESDAY
Milk or Tea, Chapulas, Let­

tuce & Tomato, Cheese, Crack­
ers, Fruit

THURSDAY
Milk or Tea, Sandwiches, 

Potato Salad, Pork & Beans, 
Cake

FRIDAY 
NO SCHOOL

BIG BUST
NEW YORK ~ The largest and 

most successful manhunt in U.S. 
history, spanning eight states and 
including four undercover stings, has 
led to the capture of 3,309 fugitives, 
Attorney General William French 
Smith announced recently.

HOMES FARMS RANCHES LOTS COMMERCIAL
•Ranchctte-3Bedroom Home on 18 Acres-one mile off pavement. 
Good place to raise family-545000.00

• • •

JH Ranchette-5 Acres 3 bedroom-2 baths. Near town Central 
Heat&Air-6ys old, Sprinler system-2 barns-Level land-200 yds. 
off pavement-Beautiful-must see to appreciate.

* • *

Nice 3-2-1 Brick. Large bedrooms central heat-new roof. 50 H-8
* * *

3-2-Double carport, den, dining area . 
1 acre 25-H10

bar-lots of storage on
approx.

* * *

3-1-double carport-on corner-partial brick free standing- 
fireplace-fruit trees, new roof, approx 1400 sq. ft. reduced to 
525,000 25-H9

* * *

Ready to sell 2-1-1 Aluminum siding 25-H-8 
H.C Reid Broker
Roy Whitt 272-3058
Thursie Reid 272-5318
Joy Whitt 272-3058

tJ/iu ^akdtik"

One Rack Party Dresses
Sizes up to 20 Q ff

One Rack Skirts
2 5 %  off

Famous Fashions & Fabrics
127 Main 272-5056

Laverne James, Helen Free, 
Gwyn Murray came Thursday 
afternoon to play Skip-Bo. Mr. 
J.E. Embry and Maud Kersey 
came to play dominoes.

Fri. morning a film was 
shown in the Day Room. We 
have received our new projector 
from the auxiliary this gift was 
perchased by money to be 
received from the Christmas 
card project. We are so anxious 
to use it; and so excited about 
having it. We are sure it will be 
put to good use.

• • •

Fri. afternoon the J.O.Y. 
Choir of the First Bapt. Church 
came to have a Devotional in 
song, with the residents. Mrs. 
Odom lead several songs-Lois 
Ethridge, of the Nursing Home, 
lead a song. Wanda Lewis 
accompaned at the piano. Re­
freshments of finger sand- 
whiches and punch were served. 

***
Mr. J.C. Shanks came Sat. to 

cut the mens hair and give 
shaves.

* * *

Sun. morning the Muleshoe 
Church of Christ brought 
communion for their church 
family. Mr. Patterson came 
Sun. morning for Bible Study. 
Sun. afternoon tb** Calvary 
Bapt. Church came to give the 
Residents some sp«. Mai Christ­
mas music.

* * *

Tues. the Hospital and 
Nursing Home aux. spent the 
Day decorating, working in their 
Beauty Shop-Shampooing & fix­
ing the ladies hair, giving 
manecures and playing Skip-Bo. 
Thank You ladies, we are really 
enjoying the decorations. We 
envite you to come enjoy them 
with >s.

We all get tithe Christmas n 
Spirit when vie go by Mr. Peats'd 
room and hear the beautiful 
Christmas tapes that he is 
playing.

* * *

Mr. Street was visited by his 
son and daughter-in-law Tues.

* * *

Ruby Lee Kerr watched the 
film the History of country 
music with Ernest Kerr in the 
Day Room Wed. morning.

• * *

We are happy to report that 
Aronld Morris is now living at 
home. His daughter Barbara 
tells us he is doing good. Mr. 
Morris visits Grace every day. 
Here in the Nursing Home.

* * *

Mr. Scoggins took Mr. Dean 
out to do some business Wed.

* * *

Lois Ethridge was visited by 
her grandson Tues.

* * •

Celo Bellar has been visited 
by her grandson Larry & her 
husband this week.

* * *

Madge Clements is visited 
almost everyday by her son 
Fred and Ann.

* * *

Among those visiting Clara 
Weaver lately are Maud 
Kersey, Jerry Hutton, her 
husband Quinn, Rev. and Mrs. 
Allen Jennings of Crosbyton.

The Muleshoe High School 
FHA came Wed. afternoon to 
help with the decorating. We 

to Thurs.

READING IS FUNDAMENTAL—Monday afternoon, representatives from Hereford, Plainview and 
Muleshoe were at the Bailey County Civic Center, for distribution of children’s books for the RIF 
program. Some 93 children and around 20 adults were on hand for the distribution. Also attending 
were Alvina Lopez, area supervisor and Adelia Sarabia, educational trainer, both of Plainview. Santa 
Claus visited during the afternoon. Pictured here is the group from the Texas Migrant Council 
school.
Teague on the death of her 
brother, John Jacobs.

are looking foreward 
night when they will come to
sing Christmas Carols.

* * *

We want to express our 
sincere svmoathv to Retha

* * •

Thurs. morning Clara Lou 
Jones and Zora Mae Bellar lead 
•the residents in Gospel and 
Christmas songs. Lois Ethridge 
also lead a song. We all enjoy 
this special time^

* * •

Thurs. afternoon Gwyn 
Murray and Mark went to 
Farwell to bring some of our 
former residents back to visit 
and play Skip-Bo. On their 
arrival Lois Ethridge and Lena 
Ruthhardt had popped a large 
bowl of buttered popcorn, to be 
eaten as we visited and played 
games. Residents from Farwell 
were Ora Roberts, Effie Smith, 
Alma Henley. Laverne James, 
Clara Crain, J.E. Embry were 
among those who came to visit 
and play Skip-Bo.

Fri. afternoon Ernest Kerr, 
Lois Ethridge, Fred Peat, Rosa 
Holland, Margaret Beard, Cleo 
Bellar, painted several different 
things in Ceramic Class.

* • *

Madge Clements and Hylton 
Moore in WJP-M.C~.at this 
time. ,We miss them and want 
them to hurry and get well.

***
Mr. Patterson came for Bible 

Study Sun. morning. The Mule­
shoe Singers came to sing 
Gospel Songs Sun. afternoon.

* * *

Wed. afternoon Karen Harris 
brought her G.A.’s from the 
First Baptist Church to "carol” 
to the residents and to visit. 
They also made tray favors to 
be put on the residents trays 
Christmas Day. The girls 
brought smiles to our faces.

Our thanks to Mr. and Mrs. 
J.T. Shofner for the large plate 
of homemade peanut brittle for 
the employees. Also to Elsie 
Williams for the carmel com.

* * *

Cleo Bellar was visited re­
cently by her daughter-in-law 
Darlene, her granddaughter 
Cherl and her sister Mrs. 
Harper.

* • «

Ernest Kerr was visited Wed. 
by Mylinda Kerr, and Ruby 
Lee. His brother has visited 
recently.

* * *

Margaret Beard’s sister-in- 
law visited Tues.

* * *

We love to get mail at the 
nursing home. How our resi­
dents would enjoy a Christmas 
card from you.

* * *

Claudia Cannon was visited 
Wed. by her daughter-in-law 
from Wolforth. We are so happy 
to hear that Mr. Cannon is 
getting along real well after his 
surgery.

We wish to thank the special 
lady that brought the "laugh­
ing” clown to visit us Tues. 
afternoon.

* * *

We thank our friends who are 
donating such nice gifts for our 
Country Store. It is unbelievable 
all the nice gifts you have 
brought.

* * *

Reminder: The Anchor
Brothers in concert at the 
nursing home Thurs. Dec.20th 
6:oo p.m. Please come.

* * *

Mrs. Nader brought her 
F.H .A. group to carol the 
residents Thurs. night. We 
enjoyed them.

* * *

Our thanks to Robert Finney 
and Robert Montgomery of the 
Muleshoe State Bank for the 
gift of the large boxes of 
delicous chocolates.

* * •

Our residents families have 
decorated their loved one’s 
rooms so pretty. Come by the 
nursing home for a tour of 
Christmas Wonderland. Stop 
and visit Fred Peat, Douglas 
Morrfts, Josephine Wenner and 
Clara W eaver's rooms. We 
think they are so pretty.

* * *

Merry Christmas to you and 
yours from the residents and 
staff.

* * *

Thank you Truth Seekers, for 
supporting our craft class.

• * *

Lona Embry, thank you for 
the Christmas decorations. They 
look lovely in the Day Room.

* * *

ARMS TALK
SANTA BARBARA. CALIF. -  

The United States and the Soviet 
Union, hoping io improve the climate 
for arms agreements, will open new 
negotiations in January in Geneva 
aimed at curbing nuclear weapons 
and space weapons, the superpowers 
announced recently.

We would like to welcome our 
new resident-She is Jessie  
Sanders she was born Jan 8, 
1895, she is a Methodist. She is 
from Earth formerly of Mule­
shoe. Welcome Mrs. Sanders to
our Nursing Home family.

* * *

We envite you to come hear 
the Anchor brothers sing, at 
6:00 p.m. Thurs. Dec. 20th in
the Nursing Home Day Room. 

•**

Journal Society 
Policy

A processing charge of 53 
is made when a photo 
accompanies any wedding, 
engagement, or anniversary 
with the exception of anniver­
sary of 50 years or more.

Five dollars will charged 
for any shower picture taken 
by the Journal and S3 
charged for any shower 
picture accompanying a story. 
Pictures may be picked up 
after the article appears in 
the papery.

Wedding, engagement, and 
anniversary stories must be 
in the Journal office by 
Monday noon for the Thurs­
day paper, and by Thursday 
noon for the Sunday paper.

After that time, stories will 
be run on a space available 
basis. Any wedding more 
than two weeks old, when 
received, will be edited and 
only the basic information 
will be included.

Shower pictures will not be 
‘ taken without a 24 hour 
notice and copy must be in 
the office by 5 p.m., Monday 
for the Thursday paper and 5 
p.m. Thursday, for the Sun­
day paper.

n r o v r r T T T T T r r r r i i  r r r n i  • •
| Nursing Home News
»  by Joy Stancell
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I  IRON

Candy Canes
?0 Count iV>x

$197

hivvfiirAl tft hi*, pstrol x*tor. tht'd 
tvmvrrrft td thf. tfi
f«d- trwifiri KM to> mvhv frotoi
t V  firM. tot rhiYT JnvItot'frA 
rhriAcrto Ktoftnv \  fvtd. VKtnd:

JMVMr-m. HfAUftto 
m vtt. WHV toftr AvWi'h' • h ’tfttotrt
S M WVM tof thr tor

M k iV  f a  tod T'\A 1 ^  ITHtf 
WVA dto idftrtorA torptottWl fd th r

Vv th r 'A'iftfn "Wbkthtor iV»dt 
tdin 'd, nnto tto th r  vv«ft
tot Mtftrvhtor ton'd ltd' hh*. dtwl
vdtoAvfUi'Voto ttod-stol s'lAvtoi ilPS 
trtototorrv fttotd Ptnwyfl Irn'r^H- 

Hi Vi»vi fsto tnvtto<*d*i. 
*tototh tdAtoto-idjc vtntfb 'v tok 'k  
’ftofttowi** tod St w h Ws' dif?tot.

Reg 5J.97

rootori4 OOCiip
| Coffee 
I  Brewer

A41S^M-

Reo 24̂7

Ancttor Hocking 

fntnee's

Ambor Glass Cuisine
2 Piece Set W Sttcm fcssket

OMoes tô Own
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Farmers Co-op Elevators Invites All 
Friends, Patrons, & Competitors To 
Christmas Open House

Wednesday, December 19th
Beginning At 10 a.m.

Refreshments Will Be Served All Day
(Be Sure To Bring Your Wives)

Dear Santa,
1 wish you a Merry Christ­

mas. As you travel thoughout 
the world on Christmas eve may 
you find peace everywhere.

If you want some hints of 
what to give me. here is a list.

1 would like two transformers, 
G.l. Joe and a Cobra See you on 
Chrismas eve.

with love 
Raul Rojas

Dear Santa,
1 wish you a Merry Christ­

mas. As you travel throughout 
the world Christmas Eve may 
you find peace everywhere.

If you want some hints of 
what to give me heres a list 
Will you please, give me a 
Hover craft and weights and 
G .l. Joe headquarters, and 
more G I Joe and Cobra men. I 
want some more op shirts.

With love 
Eric 

McElroy

#  Dear Santa Claus
I wish you a Merry Christ­

mas. As you travel throughout 
the world. Christmas Eve may 
you find peace everywhere.

If you want some hints of 
what to give me, here is a list of 
what 1 want. I want a stomper 
and 1 hope it comes with some 
batteries. And I want a cqrvet 
transformer. And I hope it is

•  real nice and will you please 
send it.

And
Love

From,
Randy

Medrano

Dear Santa Claus,
I hope you been having a 

good summer this year. Will 
#  you please bring me a Castle 

Grey Skull and a battle cat and 
a GoBot. and one more thing 
after that. A He-man boxing 
bag, I love you Santa Claus.

Quint Ellis
P.S. Leave our gifts at Grans.

Letters To Santa
Dear Santa

1 hope you had a good year. 
Pleas bring me Cabbage Patch 
Diapers.

Thank you 
Merry Christmas 

Love, 
Mary Rivera

Dear Santa,
1 hope you had a good year

Elease bring me a He-Man, My 
ittle Pony, Cabbage Patch Girl, 

frucks. “ Thank you Merry 
Christmas!

Love
Kimberly Smith

Dear Sant
I hope you had a good year. 

Please bring me a baby bed. 
Thank you Merry Christmas?

Love 
Kayla Clark

Dear Santa
1 hope you had a good year. 

Please bring me a Gin Cabbage 
Patch Kid a hula Hoop Thank 
you Merry Christmas!

Love 
Tyla Hinkson

Dear Santa
I hope you had a good year. 

Please bring me a 4 wheeler.
Thank you 

Merry Christmas 
Love 

Greg Cortez

Dear Santa,
1 am 6 years old and in 

Kindergarten. I have been good 
this year. Please bring me a 
Crystal Ken, a play oven, a pair 
of skates and motorbike for 
Barbie. My brother Cade is 1 
year old and he wants a rocking 
horse. We will leave you cookies 
and milk.

Love, 
Heather Hooten

Dear Santa,
My name is Amy and I am 4 

years old. I have been real 
good. I help my mommy and 
daddy. Please bring me a three 
wheel motorbike, and Rainbow 
Brite and her horse. I love you, 
Santa, My brother Cade has 
been good, too. So don’t forget 
him Remember my sister 
Heather, too.

Love, 
Amy Hooten

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 

Patch, Rainbow Brite and Rain­
bow Brites little friend, Barbie 
Bike. I was good all year. 1 will 
lev something to eat. Thank you 
it is milk and cookies.

Love 
Netty Sigala

Dear Santa,
Please bring me Super Pants, 

Shirt Hot Tops Bike, 1 will leave 
you something to eat. Thank 
you Santa.

Love, 
Marcos Reyes

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a bike, a 

Cabbage Patch Kid, new pants. 
I will leave you something to 
eat.

Love, 
Ana Pacheco

Dear Santa,
Please bring me Cabbage 

Patch doll, strawberry short 
cake baby skates and a barbie 
doll. I was good all year. I will 
leave you something to eat. 
Thank You.

Love,
Rhonda Crawford

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Trans­

former Gun and shock wave 
Autobat Jet. 1 was good all 
year. I will leave you some milk 
and cookies.

Love, 
Gage Tosh

Dear Santa,
Please bring me grelim shoes, 

I was good all year. I will leave 
you something to eat. Thank 
you.

Love,
Berlinda Cavazos

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 

Patch doll. Gremlin, Baby, 
skates, bike. 1 was good all 
year. I will leave you something 
to eat. Thank you.

Love,
Veronica Franco

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a bike a shirt 

and pants and shoes. 1 was 
good all vear. I will leave you 
something to eat. Thank you.

Love, 
Amy Hood

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 

Patch doll. I have been very 
good. Here are some cookies for 
you. Thank you.

Love, 
Raquel Franco

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Rainbow 

Brite doll. I have been very 
good this year.

Love,
Lucinda Cavazos

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a BMX bike. 

I have been very good this year. 
Here are some cookies and milk 
for you. Thank you.

Love, 
Wayne Palmer

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a bike. 1 

have been very good this year. 
Here are some milk and cookies 
for you. Thank you, Santa.

Love, 
Dennis Reeder

Dear Santa,
1 want a boy Barbie my little 

pony house a Rainbow Brite 
Kitchen. Cabbage Patch doll. I 
love you, Santa. I love Rudolf. 
Thany you for the toys.

Love, 
Amy Flanary

Dear Santa Claus,
1 have been good this year. 1 

want a Castle Grayskull, and 
Snake mountain. 1 want a 
Inspector Gadget doll. If you 
been watching Inspector Gadget 
you will know what he looks like 
too. I Love you, Santa Claus! 
This is what Transformer. It is a 
semi Truck.

lazbuddie santa letters 

Dear Santa,
K-a Preemie doll, and books. 

Wish my grand-parents, parents 
would come to see me.

Thank you 
I Love you 

Katy Jones
Dear Santa,

Please bring me a Cabbage 
Patch cat and a Dream Dancer. 
I hope Charletta does not go 
back to the hospital. Thank you.

I Love you 
Heather Engelking

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a micro­

scope, a telescope, and some 
book.

1 hope my dad will get better. 
Thank you.

I Love you, 
Carissa Renee Buie

Dear Santa,
A Cabbage Patch Kid and 

books.
I wish I could be with my 

uncles and aunts. Thank you.
I Love you, 

Josephine Cortez

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a He-man 

castle and a Stomper.
I wish my dad was aich so he 

could pay the bills. Thank you.
1 Love you, 
Roel Moran

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a soldier and 

a car wit batteries.
I wish my Grandma was here. 

Thank you.
I Love you 
Jr. Lopez

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a toy car and 

a school bag. Thank you.
I Love you, 

Jyan

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a trans­

former jet.
I hope you will have a good 

year. Thank you.
I Love you, 

Adolfo Mata

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 

Patch boy and cloths. I hope we 
don’t have a war. Thank you.

I Love you 
David Seaton

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a car.
I wish my dad would have

money.
Thank you, 

Jesus

Dear Santa Claus,
This year I wish for a 

Trapperkeeper, a New Born, a 
pair of sandals that are gray 
with white spots and a bow on 
the end of the sandals, a jacket 
like Lori Bradshaw’s a pair of 
jeans, and a brownish puppy.

Love, 
Shannon Moore
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Sudan Basketball Neivs

Basketball got underway in 
full force at Sudan High this 
week as the varsity teams won 
100 percent of their games. The 
Hornets defeated Farwell Friday 
night in a close game 49-45 and 
Springlake-Earth Tuesday 43-36 
in an emotional game for the 
fans. The Homettes downed the 
ferns from Farwell 65-17 and 
followed that wish a sound 
defeat of 63-30 to Spring­
lake-Earth.

Th ; Hornets got off to a slow
start against Farwell lagging 
behind 12-9 at the end of the 
first quarter but surged ahead 
behind the shooting of Jeff 
Kinnie and tied the score 21-21 
as the halftime whistle blew.

Farwell went ahead and 
maintained a slim lead through­
out the third quarter although 
Jerry Dodson began connecting 
with the basket for Sudan. 
Going into the final period down 
35-30 did not hamper the 
Hornets as they continued 
struggling and edged ahead of 
the Steers in the final minutes 
of the game. Jerry Dodson led 
the scoring for Sudan with 18 

•ints, 16 of these in the second 
alf. Kinnie was close with 16,Eo 
&

!*
i EMT

Muleshoe i
1EMT

Association

WHAT IS AN EMT?
WHY HE CAN HELP YOU!
You’ve been in a serious 

accident. The first person to 
approach you tells you he is an 
Emergency Medical Technician 
(EMT).

Your first response might be 
“what’s that to me?” They 
make up fancy names for 
anything these days.”

To you, it may be life or 
death; EMT’s prevent a large 
percentage of pre-hospital 
deaths from medical emergenc­
ies in our country.

An EMT may be a fireman, 
ambulance driver, law enforce­
ment officer, or a nurse or just 
an average citizen. But, he or 
she is certified with the highest 
level of emergency training. All 
have completed a 120-140 hour 
course in advanced emergency 
care and are certified by the 
Texas Department of Health.

EMTs are prepared to meet 
em ergencies including heart 
attacks (through the use of 
cardio-pulmonary resuscitation), 
emergency childbirth, the tech­
niques of extracation (removing 
victims from wrecked vehicles) 
and advanced back injuries with 
the use of a backboard.

The EMT course also includes 
treatment of all types of 
fractures, other bodily 'njuries, 
problems of the newborn 
patient, and environmental 
emergencies.

The EMT spends 40 hours of 
his course doing in-hospital 
emergency room training.

EMTs then keep abreast of 
medical advances through an 
Emergency Medical Services 
continuing education program.

Emergency <-are attendants, 
EC A, CPR, certified individuals 
and firstaiders are among lower 
levels of trained volunteers in 
the area.

The members of the Mule- 
shoe EMT Association are very 
proud and excited to be EMTs, 
and in a position to serve their 
community.

By Evelyn Ritchie

12 of these in the first half. 
Others adding points for Sudan 
were Charlie Fisher, 6; Jeff 
Dodson, 4; David Wood, 5.

Sudan got the tip-off in the 
Springlake-Earth game but the 
first shot didn’t go and S-E 
scored on a rebound shot. 
Kinnie wasted no tim** in 
putting Sudan on the board with 
a net-ripper from outside. Then 
seconds later added another 
long shot to put sudan ahead
4- 2. Sudan maintained the lead 
throughtout the game although
5- E came close several times. 
S-E went into bonus early in the 
^ame as Sudan received 10 
'ouls in the first half compared 
ic 2 for the Wolverines. S-E 
scored 7 of their 11 first half 
points from the free throw line 
although they went to the line 
16 times while Sudan shot 2 FT 
in the first half.

Going into the second half a 
four-point lead, 15-11, Sudan

Bulled further ahead when Jerry 
odson sank a turn-around 

bullet. David Wood received a 
hand-off under the basket and 
added two points before Sudan 
hit a dry spell plagued by 
turnovers. Kinnie started the 
scoring again as he laid one up 
for two points from the center of 
the lane. Fisher added two 
points from underneath and 
Jerry Dodson made the score 
25-19 on a turn-around shot 
with 2 minutes left in the third

period. S-E got two free shots 
when Sudan was called for 
fouling on a blocked shot and 
drew within four points 25-21. 
Sudan missed six shots before 
S-E got the rebound and ran the 
clock down but missed the final 
shot.

Brent Kirkland put Sudan 
ahead 27-21 on a long jumper 
and Fisher added four points on 
rebound shots. Sudan main­
tained at least a five point lead 
then the rest of the game with 
most of the last points coming 
from the free shot line. Jerry 
Dodson sank four and Kirkland 
two in the final two minutes.
Jerry Dodson led the scoring 
with 16, hitting 50% of the field 
goals and 100% of his free 
shots. Jeff Kinnie had 12 points 
hitting 6 of 12 from the floor. 
Charlie Fisher hit 3 of 4 from 
the floor for 6 points, Kirkland 
hit both of his long shots from 
the floor for 100% shooting and 
2 of from the line for a total of 6

Klints. Wood had 3 points. The 
ornets shot 52.9% from the 

floor Tuesday night making 
their season shooting record 
40.2%. They are hitting a total 
of 57.4% of their shots from the 
line and are averaging 29 
rebounds per game. Jeff Kinnie 
is leading the team in points 
scored this season with 59. 
Fisher led the team in rebounds 
Tuesday with 14 although Jerry 
Dodson is leading the season 
with 48.

***
Sharia Harrison led the 

scoring for Sudan in the first

G:riod against Farwell when the 
ornettes took an overwhelming 

17-0 lead. Farwell managed 2 
points in the second period 
when Sudan added 24 points for

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Edward Curtis Gregory and 

Glynda Van Matre, Sudan 
Ronald Lynn Cosby, Sudan 

and Kinberly Ann Johnson, 
Muleshoe

Raul Martinez Sanchez and 
Maria Hellen Chapa, Morton 

Garry Wayne Floyd, Mule­
shoe and Tamela Odeal 
Stillwell, Friona

WARRANTY DEEDS 
George E. Nieman and wife, 

Dianne M. Nieman to Darrel 
Nutscheler and wife, Barbara 
Nutschler—A one acre tract of 
land out of the S/2 of Section 
No. 79, Block Y, WD&FW 
Johnson’s Subdivision No. 2, 
Bailey County, Texas.

L.F. McCormick, the sole and 
only surviving Trustee for Fair- 
view Church of Christ, and A.E. 
Scarbrough, the sole and only 
other male member of such 
congregation to the Arch L. 
Ferguson Foundation---All of 
Lots Numbers (7) and (8), in 
Block Number 10), Lenau 
Subdivision to the City of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 

Edna Marie Haynes to James 
Kenneth Haynes—North 19 feet 
of Lot 5, and the South 56 feet 
of Lot 4, Block 1, Muleshoe 
Park Addition to the Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 

Davy D. Cavitt and wife, 
Blonnie J. Cavitt to Doris Jean 
Kelton—All of the (SE 70’) of 
Lots Numbers (9) and (10), in 
Block Number (1), Riverside 
Addition to the Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 

Paul Cox and wife, Patsy Cox 
to James Thomas Lee and wife, 
Patricia Alice Lee—A 1.267 acre 
tract of land, out of the (NE 
1/4) of Section 53, Block Y, 
WD&FW Johnson Subdivision, 
Bailey County, Texas 

Wilma Dorine Harbin to

\  303 MAIN m l CLOVIS, NM

*9-10*
At Musicians' Hideaway, we give you more of what you 
go to a music store for: A  Better Sound - At A  Better 
Price. We have this areas largest selection of new and 
used musical equipment including guitars, amplifiers, 
drums, electric pianos, synthesizers, PA Systems, 
microphones, and more, including all kinds of ac­
cessories, by the top names in the music industry.

AND FOR THAT SPECIAL MUSICIAN, WE'VE GOT THE
“Guitar Tune-Up Kit”

fo r o n ly^  1 5 * *
•A S.t ol Sender Acoustic or Electric Strings 

(Make it sound like new)
•A 6-note pitch pipe (Keep it tuned up)
•Cuitor polish and polish cloth 

(protect it ond shine it up real pretty)
•A string winder (moke re stringing taster t easier)
•A doien picks with o pick pouch 

(you won t lose those picks os often)

A U  THIS IN A CONVENIENT PACKAGE WORTH 
OVER *2 4 .0 0 , BUT HOW ONLY *1 5 .9 5  AT THE STORE WITH 

SERVICE, REPAIR, RENTAL A LESSONS

The M o st For Y o u r 
M usic  D o lla r"

KVjicians’fft
4 101 MAIN <1

A W A

Hidieaua.S'

Robert Ray Cowley and wife, 
Deborah Elaine Cowley---Lot 
No. 13 and the Easterly 30 feet 
of Lot No. 12, in Block Number 
15, Country Club Addition to 
the City of Muleshoe, Bailey 
County, Texas

Effie Jane Williams to J.W. 
Roberts and wife, Thelda Ruth 
Roberts--All of Lot Number 
(15), in Block Number (2), 
Harvey Addition to the Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 

Charles F. Lorance to Lillie 
Smith—All of Lots Numbers 
(78). (80), (82), and (84), Block 
Number (7), Apple Street, to 
the Town of Progress, Bailey 
County, Texas

COUNTY COURT 
Ramon Ferrer DW1 $250 Fine 

2 Years Probation
Michael Eugene Slaughter 

DWI $350 Fine 2 Years Proba­
tion

Anselmo Regalado Drivin 
While License Suspended $1 
Fine 6 Months Probation 

DISTRICT COURT 
State of Texas and Bailey 

County Vs. J.R. King Order of 
Dismissal

Five Area Telephone Cooper­
ative, Inc. Vs. Crockett Pump 
and Machine, Inc. and Homer 
Richardson Judgment 

State of New Mexico, Ex Rel, 
Department of Human Services 
Petitioner Vs. Ted Everidge, Jr. 
Order For Dismissal

NEW VEHICLES 
Bailey Co. Elec. Coop Assn., 

1985 GMC PU, Robert D. 
Green, Inc.

SM ALL
W ONDER

/4 m a i t a
C O M P A C T  

M I C R O W A V E  O V E N

Save space and cook last and easy 
with this Amana microwave oven Its 
compact size fits almost anywhere 
and you get many wonderful "big 
oven" features
• 500 W ATTS O f  COOKING POWER cooks in 

just v, m» conventional lime
• DEFROST CONTROL tnaws frozen food fait
• EASY DIAL TIMER nas adjustable speeds 10 

20 minutes
• SEE THROUGH DOOR AND INTERIOR 

LIGHT mare it easy to see food as it cooks

• REMOVABLE COOKING TRAY catenas spins
and Doilovers

• AMANA MICROWAVE OVEN COOKBOOK

Buy the Amana Com pact Microwave 

O van at:

Harvey Bass Appl.
122 a  1st 272-3030

a 41-2 lead at halftime. Jeannia 
Nix scored 10 points in the 
second quarter. Fouls hurt 
Farwell as they had 12 the first 
half while Sudan never com­
mitted the bonus applying fifth 
foul.

Sudan added 24 points in the 
last half while Farwell hit four 
from the floor and seven free 
throws for a game total of 17 
points compared to 65 for the 
Hornets. Jeannia Nix was high 
point with 17, followed by 
Harrison with 12, Wooley had 
13; Melissa Nix and Keitha 
Scott each hit 2 field goals and 
2 FT for 6 points; Sherrie 
Powell and Shawnda Masten 
both had 2 FG for 4 points, Kim 
Crowson scored 3.

In Tuesday’s game against 
Springlake-Earth, Sudan made a 
fast start and scored six points 
in the first minute. Sudan got 
the tip-off and Masten hit the 
first basket. Sudan got the ball 
on turnover and Harrison put it 
through the hoop for two points. 
Then Sherrie Powell hit an 
outside shot after another S-E 
turnover. S-E did not manage to 
score until after 4 minutes of 
play and Sudan has a 10-0 lead. 
Wooley hit a jumper and 
Jeannia added a baseline shot 
before S-E did not manage to 
score until after 4 minutes oi 

lay and Sudan had a 10-0 lead, 
ooley hit a jumper and 

Jeannia added a baleline shot 
before S-E added their second 
score. Wooley hit an under-the- 
basket shot to make the score 
16-4. Sudan got the ball back 
with 6 seconds to go and 
Jeannia sank a long shot at the 
buzzer which was disallowed by 
the referee, making the first

Jjuarter score 16-4. Sudan added 
ifteen points during the second 

period while their opponents hit 
for 10, thus bringing the score 
to 31-14 at halftime.

The Hornettes continued to 
add points in the third period as 
Wooley hit from underneath and 
Jeannia from the baseline be­
fore S-E scored four
unanswered points, 35-18. 
Shawnda Masten added two on 
a drive and Nix sank a basket 
on a fast break. Wooley added 
another two points under the 
basket on a good pass from J. 
Nix with four minutes to play. 
Good defense caused S-E turn­
overs and J. Nix hit on a jumper 
from the line and Wooley added 
two on a rebound shot bringing 
the third quarter score to 47-22. 
Sudan scored 16 points in the 
final period compared to 8 for 
S-E making the score 63-30. 
Wooley was high point with 19, 
sinking 8 of 12 FG and 3 for 3 
at the FT line. J. Nix had 16

Koints hitting 8 of 13 from the 
oor. Harrison scored 10 points 

hitting 5 of 10 FG while Sherrie 
Powell hit 2 of 5 FG and 1 of 2 
FT for 5 points. Keitha Scott 
has 1 of 2 FT. For the season 
the girls have a 6-1 record. 
Jeannia Nix leads the scoring 
with 91 points. She is hitting 
50% of her FG and 82% FT. 
JoAnn Wooley is shooting 65%

from the floor and Harrison is 
hitting 61% from the floor. 
Harrison and Wooley are neck 
and neck on rebounds with 52 
and 51. The team is hitting 46% 
of their shots from the floor and 
51% from the line. They have 
scored 337 points in seven 
gam es while allowing their 
opponents 214.

Both the Hornets and the 
Hornettes will be engaged in 
tournament play this week at
the local gyms.•••

All 10 players on the Junior 
Varsity team saw action against 
the Farwell team and took a big 
16-6 halftime lead. The 
terns put 11 more points on the 
board during the third period 
while Farwell only managed to 
scored twice for four points. 
Sudan did not falter as they 
continued in the final period 
with 13 points holding Farwell 
to six.

Kim Crowson received the 
scoring honors at 13 with six FG 
and 1 FT. Dannette Provence 
sank 4 FG and 1 FT for 9 
points. Keitha Scott 'dded 4 FG 
for 8. Cindy Brotherton, S. Peck 
and Kathy Powell each hit for 2 

oints. Melissa Nix had 2 FG 
or four points.

Springlake-Earth scored first 
but Kathy Powell hit the bottom 
of 2 FT to start the scoring for 
Sudan before S-E added another 
2 points. However, Sudan took 
an early lead as Powell hit a 
jumper for a 4-3 score. Sudan 
was in the bonus midway first

Rriod when Kim Crowson hit 2 
‘ and then put in a rebound 

shot for another 2. Powell 
scored on a good pass from 
crowson to give Sudan a 10-6 
lead at the end of the first 
quarter. S-E only got off one 
shot in the last 6 minutes of the 
first period and that was fast 
break after intercepting a 
JJornette pass.

Sudan had several turnovers 
beginning the second period 
before Cindy Brotherton nit for 
2 FT and Crowson added 1 from 
the line to give them a 13-10 
halftime lead.

S-E pulled to within one 
point, 15-14 midway third 
quarter before Brotherton hit a 
long shot with 58 seconds to 
give Sudan a three-point lead

fc

going into the final period. 
Sudan more than doubled their 
score in the fourth period, 
scoring 19 points, while S-E hit 
2 FG and 4 of 12 FT for 8 points 
to give the Hornettes a 36-22 
victory. Crowson was high point 
with 12, followed by Brotherton 
with l l i  Powell had 7 and
Provence 6. .

The Junior Varsity boys had a 
big fourth quarter against Far- 
well but came out one point 
short on the scoreboard 35-36. 
Farwell took a first quarter lead 
12-8 and upped that to 22-16 by 
halftime. Both teams were cold 
during the third period, but 
Sudan hit for 16 points in the 
final period while holding Far- 
well to 9 points. Sudan hit 3 of 
7 FT in the final period while 
Farwell hit 3 of 4, which could 
have been the difference of 
winning and losing. Wade 
Donnel did the scoring for 
Sudan with 7 points while 
Murillo had six, D. Williams 
and A. Williams each hit for 5 
points, Gardner and Gunn each 
added 4 points, Griggs had 3 
and Salinas a FG in the first 
period for 2 points.

Springlake-Earth JV boys 
came out running and put 20 
points on the board during the 
first period while Sudan 
managed 3 FG for 6 points. The 
scoring was even in the second 
quarter with 9 each but Sudan 
went to the locker room trailing 
29-15. The Hornets lost 4 more 
points during the third period as 
S-E added 12 points to the 
scoreboard while Sudan had 8. 
Sudan came back in the final 
period and outscored S-E 17-14, 
but lost the contest 55-42.

Donnell again led the scoring 
with 5 FG and 2 of 2 FT for 12 
points. Gardner had 4 FG and 1 
FT for 9 points, Bartley sank 
three FG and 1 FT for 7. A. 
Williams hit 2 FG for 4 points. 
Conley, Griggs, Gunn, Boyless 
added 2 points each. Again FT 
hurt the Hornets as they hit 4 of 
17 from the line.

* • * •
Some of our citizens 

are so organized that 
they haven’t tim e to 
mind their own busi­
ness.

Pete Guinn Jr.
Announces

The Opening Of His New Chevrolet Dealership

Guinn Chevrolet Inc.
Hwy 380 East - Tahoka,Tx 

Phone 998-5521

Pete extends a cordial invitation to his many 
friend'* and customers in the Muleshoe area to come 
by and visit with him at his new Chevrolet Dealership 
In Tahoka, Texas For:

"A Better Deal" From A Better From 
A Dealer Who Will "Appreciate Your 
Business"

Call Pete
AT

Guinn Chevrolet Inc.
998-5521 Tahoka,Texas

GM Parts & Service GMAC Financings
"You'll Like The Way We Do Business"

CHEVROLET GM QUALITY 
SERVICE PARTS

M M IBAl MOTORS CORBORATIOH

I
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I I Sudan News
By Evelyn Ritchie

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Beckett 
TuFe *n Midland during the 
Thanksgiving holidays to visit 
their son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. David Beckett.

*****
Winona Dudgeon was in 

Graham during the Thanks­
giving holidays to visit her 
mother, Mrs. Frances Blair and 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Stovall.

Paula and Lee Anne Ellison 
both of Lubbock were Thanks­
giving holiday guests with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Ellison and were also home 
during the past weekend and 
assisted with the bridal shower 
honoring Janet Nix.

*****
Helen Churchman is a 

medical patient in the Cardio 
unit of the Methodist Hospital 
where she was taken Monday. 

*****
Mrs. Dolores Harper has 

returned home from visiting the 
past two weeks in Reklaw with 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Traweek and Steven.

*****
Andrea Thomasson of Mid­

land has been here this week 
with her mother, Mrs. Geneva 
Thomasson who is a medical 
patient in the Muleshoe Hos­
pital and with her aunt, Jerry 
Herzog.

Mr. and Mrs. Freddie Legg 
and children were in Lubbock 
Nov. 21 to attend the wedding 
of her nephew, Niarc Reed to 
Theresa Matticks. Heather was 
the flower girl and Justin was 
ring bearer.

Mrs. Charlie Lowe has return­
ed from Vernon where she 
visited the past several days 
with her cousins, Mrs. Irene 
Davis, Leona Morris and Bertha 
Goddard and her aunt and 
uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Lawson. She also visited in 
Quanah with Mrs. Ina Ingram. 
Leona and Irene brought her

home Friday and spent the 
night with her.

Mr. and Mrs. Bo Lance and 
Danya have returned home from 
Baird where they visited during 
the weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Gillett A  
family and were there to attend 
the wedding of her sister, Judy. 
Danya was flower girl.

*****
Mrs. Pearl Wright received 

word Sunday of the death of her 
sister, Mrs. Ellen Redenour in 
Cordell, Okla. Due to her illness 
Mrs. Wright was unable to 
attend funeral services.

*****
It was reported that Sterling 

Reece was taken back to the 
Amherst hospital recently 
where he remains a patient. 

*****
Mrs. Edna Bellamy was 

recently in Snyder to visit her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Bellamy. She reported that he is 
doing well. Thanksgiving guests 
with her were another son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gud Ed Bellamy and 
Shawn of Euless.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Beckett 

and Mr. and Mrs. Charles Rich 
were in Eldorado, Okla last 
week to attend funeral services 
for their brother-in-law, Lewis 
Conkler. Also attending were 
Mary Powell and Marley Hall of 
Sudan Maxine Donaldson and 
Alma Burton both of Muleshoe. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Herman 

Synatsck of Anton visited Tues­
day with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Cardwell and 
observed Glenda’s birthday 
dinner, with them.

*****
Gary Fields and David Harper 

were among college students 
home for the weekend.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Marty Collins, 

Nathan and Tommy Lee of 
Amarillo visited Sunday with 
their grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Collins.

*****
Mrs. Verdie Gann has been in 

Olustee, Okla. this week visiting 
with Mr. and Mrs. Ed Drury. 

*****
Some more snow fell on

Tuesday with temperatures 
staying very low. On Wednes­
day around noon, the tempera­
ture went up enough to thaw 
out the ice and melt the snow. 
Some farmers are anxiously 
awaiting a good long dry warm 
spell to dry out the cotton so
they can continue gathering it. 

*****
The Toys for Tots campaign is 

well underway. The Young 
Homemakers and Firemens 
Auxiliary are sponsoring the 
campaign this year. A box is at 
Bellar’s for the Toys and you 
may give your donations to 
Micheile Edwards at the First 
National Bank or to Sandra 
Franks.

It asked that all toys and 
donations be in by Monday, 
Dec. 17.

*****
Among those from Sudan who 

were in Lubbock Dec. 2 to 
attend the ballet, The Nutcrack­
er were Salina Lynn, Peggy 
Ray, Jennifer and Candace 
Lynn, Yvonne Pierce, Doris 
Pierce, Heather Pierce and
Regina Pierce.

*****
Mrs. McAlpin’s fourth grade 

class selects a “ Citizen of the 
Week” each week. The students 
vote on the one chosen. The 
first week in November there 
was a tie with Amy Martinez 
and Clint Humphreys winning; 
Second week, Kaylenn Nix; 3rd 
Week-Roxann Gunn and the 
fourth week was another tie 
between Teresa Williams and 
John Damron. The first week in 
December, the honor went to 
Melissa Richards.

Terri Ray, Jill Ried, Candy 
Weaver, Lee Ann Sellars, John 
Damron, Clint Humphreys, Amy 
Martinez, Mistie Miller,
Kaylenn Nix, Melissa Richards, 
Wally Flores, Michael Jeffer­
son, Patricia Jackson, Teresa 
Williams, Janie Lopez, Roxanne 
Gunn and their teachers, Mrs. 
McAlpin, Mrs. Loretta Reid, 
Mrs. Sandra Nix, Brooke and 
Breanne Baker.

The Deacons of the FBC held 
their annual dinner with 
Mexican food Monday night in 
the fellowship hall of the 
church.

Attending were the pastor 
and wife, Rev. and Mrs. Jerry 
Dodson, and deacons and wives,
Mr. and Mrs. B«Uy Chester, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pat Kent, Mr. and 
Mrs. Halbert Harvey, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gaylon Burns, Mr. and 
Mrs. Nolan Parrish, and Mrs. 
Calvin Vernon, Mrs. J.P. 
Arnold and Mrs. Gus Bellamy.

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I want a rainbow 
Brite and for my sister. 1 wish 
your bing fine and also your 
sweet. How are you doing Mrs. 
Santa? 1 hope your doing fine 
also. Have I been gooi Santa? 
We made reindeers. And my 
friend are doing good.

Love,
Lisa

Dear Santa,
My brother wants a bicycle. I 

want a Castle Grasco. My mama 
wants a new skirt. That's all she 
wants. That's all me and my 
brother want too.

Love,
Howie Zimmerman

Dear Santa
1 want a Cabbage Patch doll 

and a Stawberry Shortcake 
house. 1 want a Rainbow Brite. 
I’m going to leave you a 
present, Santa Claus. I’ve been 
good this year.

Love,
Jennifer Patterson 

Out Done
Angry widow (after 

hearing husband has left 
her nothing):

“ I want you to take 
‘Rest in Peace’ off that 
tombstone I ordered yester­
day.”

Engraver: “ I can’t do 
that, but I can add some­
thing else."

Widow: "All right, add 
‘Till We Meet Again.' ”

Thanksgiving holiday visitors in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Rick 
Gipson. Dickie and Rickie were 
his brothers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Gipson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Derick Gipson of Stinnett and 
Rob -Gipson of Amarillo. Also 
visiting was her mother, Mrs. 
Opal Scroggins of Ross, Okla.

The fourth grade classes of 
Mrs. Jackie McAlpin and Mrs. 
Susan Baker were treated with a 
trip to Lubbock and to the 
ballet, the Nutcracker on 
Sunday, Dec. 2.

The Nutcracker by Pete 
Tchaikovsky was directed by 
Leonid Lubarsky and featured 
Leticia Hernandez and Zygmont 
Szostak.

Members of the class attend­
ing were Samantha pspinoza, 
Leeanne Hollingsworth, Emilya 
Martinez, David Montes, Lorena 
Mata, Gabe Narramore, Candal 
Obenhaus, Alonza Peterson,

Classified
Advertising

Brings
Great Results 

Call 272-4536

Clovis High Plains 
Hospital

welcom es

Haq
Babur, M.D.
N e u r o s u r g e o n

S i

to the C H P H  medical staff
Office Location:
Century Centre

2000 West 21st, Suite 2 
Clovis, New Mexico

Hours: 9 a m.-5 p m.. Monday - Friday

Telephone: 762-3700

Bailey Cotinty Junior Livestock Show
January 23-25 Bailey County Coliseum

The Bailey County Livestock Board would like to take this opportunity to extend their invitation to the 1985 
Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. The Board would also like to thank publicly the contributors to the

Judging Timet:
Sheep, 4 pjn. - Cottle, 7 p.m., Jan 24; 

Swine, Jan 25;
Arrival Time: 4-4 p.m. Jan 23

1984 Show, as well as to all other donors.
A-l Chemical Co.
A&B Plumbing 
A&M Farm Store 
Adrian (Lonnie) Photography 
Ag Aviation 
American Valley 
Anthony’s Dept. Store 
Antiques A  Junk 
Art Craft Printing 
Armes Equipment Co.
Roger Albertson 
Clifton Allen 
Homer Allgood 
R.D. Angeley 
J.G. Arnn
B&B Feed A  Supply 
Bailey County Delinting 
Bailey County Elec. Co-op 
Bailey County Farm Bureau 
B«:iey County Propane 
Baker Farm Supply 
Bamert Seed Co.
Barrett Produce 
Eddie’s Bar-B-Q 
Beck Gin Co.
Berry Electric 
Berry, Inc. CPA 
Birkelback Machine A  Pump 
Black Ins. Agency 
Blackwater Agriculture Asso. Inc 
Blackwater Valley Soil Conservation 
Bland Pest Control 
Bobo Ins. Agency 
Borden Milk Co.
Bovina Feeders 
Bruce & Matthews 
Buddy’s Shoes 
Bula Gin Co.
Burton’s Service Center 
Butler Mfg. Co.
Douglas Bales 
W.F. Bartley 
Harvey Bass 
Travis Bessire 
Clay Birdwell 
J.E. Birdwell 
Clifford Black 
Eugene Black 
Rex Black 
Ronnie Black 
Robert Blackwood 
Bennie Bland 
Tom K. Bonds 
Charles Bratcher 
Dee Brown 
Gary Mac Brown 
James Brown 
Don Bryant 
Cage Cattle Co

1984 Donors:
Central Compress 
Central Texaco 
Chapman Supply Co.
Chick-N-Dock 
Clovis Livestock Market 
Cochran Electric 
Combination Motors
J.L. Cox 
Claunch Gin 
Larry Calvert

Tim Campbell
Don Gements
Fred Clements
Linton J. Cope
Dale Oil Company
Damron Drug
Davis Bros. Cotton
Deaf Smith Co. Grain Processors
Dent A  Rempe
Dinner Bell Cafe
Discount Furniture
Dr. G’s Grocery
Drager Enterprieses
Dunham Appliance
Dutch Appliance
Dutch Wiikerson Cadillac Olds
Bill Dye
Earth Ag Supply 
Energas Co.
Ernest Mills Cotton Co.
First State Bank, Morton 
Fair Store
Farmer Aerial Spraying Serv. 
Farmers Co-op Assn, of Enochs 
Farmers Co-op of Lubbock 
Farmers Co-op Elevator of Muleshoe 
Federal Land Bank 
Field (Terry) Ins.
First Federal Savings A  Loan
First National Bank
Five Area Telephone
Foster Fertilizer
Franks Farm
Friona State Bank
Fry A  Cox
Funk Seed
C.J. Feagley
Randy Field
Bob Finney-
Tom Flowers
Sam Fox
B.G. Free
G A  C Auto Supply
Gallman Payloader Service
General Telephone
Green Bros. Inc.
Griswold Construction 
Carl Gable

J.C. Gatewood 
James Glaze 
Ray Griffith 
John Gunter 
John Hamblen 
Bi-Products, Hereford 
Hereford Janitorial Supply 
Henry Ins. Agency 
H A  J Equipment 
H A  W Hay Co.
Heritage House Inn 
Horn A  Gladden 
Hurst Department Store 
Frank & Dorothy Hanes 
Eugene Hawkins 
Jerry Harrison 
Jimmy Henderson 
F.D. Holt 
Ronnie Holt 
Bill Hunt 
Robert Hunt 
Irrigation Pump 
Irrigation Supply 
Wesley Isenhower 
James Crane Tire Service 
James Roy’s Meat 
Jake Diel Dirt A  Paving 
Jennings Fruit Serv.
J. L. Cox Spraying 
Jones Oil Co.
John’s Custom Mill 
Gene Paul Jarman 
Randy Johqson
K. C. Muffler 
K.M.P. Pump Co.
K-Bob's Steak House, Ltfld Plaza 
K-Bob’s Steak House 
Kemin Southwest 
Kendrick Oil Co.
King Grain Co.
Larry Kitchens 
Kiwanis Club 
Knowles Auction 
Guy Kendall 
Craig Kriby 
Ruel Kirby 
K.K. Krebbs 
Lambert Cleaners 
Edgar H. Langfitt 
Lariat Gin Co.
Leal's Restaurant 
Lee’s Western Wear 
Levelland Compress 
Levelland Vegetable Oil. Inc. 
Lenau Lumber 
Leo’s Blacksmith 
Lewis Farm A  Ranch Store 
Charles Lewis 
Lion's Club

Littlefield Butane 
Littlefield Butan^ Co.
Littlefield Delinting 
Locker, Inc.
Longhorn Spraying Inc.
Loyce Lott 
Lowe Drill & Pump 
Lubbock Electric 
Jack McCarty 
McCormick Seed A  Grain 
McMillan Bookkeeping 
Mabry Street Barbeque 
Mabgy Ditching 
Maple Co-op Gin 
Mohawk Auto Parts 
Morton Delinting 
Morrison Oil Co.
Mulchner Chevrolet, Buick, Inc. 
Muleshoe Abstract (Barry Lewis) 
Muleshoe Auto Parts 
Muleshoe Antenna 
Muleshoe Animal Clinic 
Muleshoe Gin 
Muleshoe Co-op Gin 
Muleshoe Electric 
Muleshoe Livestock Austion, Inc. 
Muleshoe Pawn Shop 
Muleshoe Publishing Co. 
Muleshoe Motor Co.
Muleshoe Supermarket
Enrique (Henry) Muyshondt, MD
Gene McGuire
J.E. McVicker
Raleigh Mason
Calvin Meissner
Rudolph Moraw
Allen Mount
Nickels & Nickels Gin
Nickels Ginning Co.
Needmore Co-op Gin
Optimist Club
P & M Farms
Pay and Save
Paco Feed Yard
Parts Plus Warehouse
Pearson’ Blade Service
Photography by Lonnie
Pivot Products Distributors. Inc.
Pioneer Seed Co.
Plains Cooperative Oil Mill 
Plainview Production Credit 
Powers Produce 
Poynor’s Whites Store 
Pleasant Valley Cafe 
Prairie View Dairy 
Prather Sheet Metal 
Progress Gin 
Puckett Trucking 
Benny Pena 
Kenneth Precure 
Bruce Purdy. M.D.
R A W Aerial Spraying Inc.
R A W Supply 
Ranch House Motel 
Ready Mix Concrete 
Reynolds A Young Equip 
Roy Reid Tire A Supply 
Robert D. Green Inc.
Roden Drug Store 
Rotary Gub 
Riverside Chemical Co.
Bill Roberson 
Darwin Robertson

Bailey County Live slock fioard

San Francisco Cal ? * *• ■
Sanitary Barber Shop • ■
Sherley Anderson, Lazbuddie Elev. 
Joe Shipman A  Sons Body Shop 
Shur-Gro Liquid Feed, Hereford 
Smith Fan’s Inc.
Smith’s L.P. Gas 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home 
Something Speical 
Southside Welding 
Southwestern Public Service 
Spudnut Shop 
State Line Irrigation 
Stovall Printing 
Strahan Garage 
Sudduth & Field & Co.
Sunbelt Seed & Delinting 
Summitt Savings 
Sun Mark Grain, Portales 
Robert Sanders 
R.L. Scott 
Kearney Scoggin 
Verlyon Scoggin 
Lewis W. Scoggin 
Don Seales 
Robert Shafer 
Eugene Shaw 
J.D. Skipworth 
Ronnie Spies 
Lucky Spurlock 
Bill Jim St. Clair 
Tommy St.Clair 
Joe Bob Stevenson 
Glynn Stroud 
Texas Sesame 
Thriftway Food Store 
Tide Products
Town A  Country Convenience Store 
Trinity Co.
Turney Pump Service
Lloyd Throckmorton
L.S. Tilger
Wayne Tunnell
Doyce Turner
Valley Grain
Valley Motel
Watson Alfalfa
West Plains Medical Center
Wiedebush A  Co.
West Camp Gin 
Western Drug 
Wes-Tex Feed Yard 
Wilson Appliance 
Wilson Drilling Co.
Williams Bros. Office Supply 
Winkler Meat Co.
Winkler Feed 
Wooley Inc.
Worley Mills Inc. (Goodland Branch) 
B.H. Wagnon 
James Warren 
Glen Watkins 
Delbert Watson 
Joe Mack Wagnon 
James Wedel 
W.R. Welch 
G.W. Wheeler 
Rheata White 
Roy Whitt 
Alex H. Williams 
Glen Williams 
Roy Wrinkle 
Frank Wuerflein 
Rusty Whitt 
Young Waldrep A  Co 
Jim Young 
Benny L. Zahn
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Homemade Christmas Candies 
The Foolproof Food Processor Way

*  i

It is claimed that fudge originated 
in the dormitories of one of the Seven 
Sisters Ivy League Women’s Colleges, 
but there is no doubt that homemade 
candy, and particularly fudge, are 
associated with the holidays.

Unfortunately, preparing home­
made candy the old-fashioned way 
can be a tricky, time-consuming 
activity, and is often abandoned in 
the interest of convenience. But with 
the help of a food processor, home­
made candy may easily return to 
your lineup of Yuletide goodies.

The most critical step in making 
fudge is determining when to stop 
beating the heated mixture and pour 
it into the pan to set. The following 
New Fashioned Christmas Fudge 
recipe from the Home Economists at 
KitchenAid takes the guesswork out 
of the fudge making process. Once 
the sugar and milk mixture reaches 
the right temperature on the candy 
thermometer, simply pour it into the 
food processor in a steady stream, 
process for about 30 seconds with 
the chocolate mixture, and you 
have a foolproof fudge sure to invoke 
visions of sugar plums.

For delectable, festive treats that 
look like they were created by a 
professional confectioner, try the 
recipe for Apricot Bon Bon Lolli­
pops. Only you need to know they 
were prepared in minutes in your 
food processor.

Homemade confections have al­
ways made impressive and much 
appreciated gifts. And now thanks 
to your food processor, they’re 
easier than ever to make.

New Fashioned Christmas Fudge
1 cup walnuts 
1 cup ffgs
1 package (12 oz.) semisweet 

chocolate bits
1 jar (7 oz.)marshmallow creme

1/2 cup butter or margarine 
1 teaspoon vanilla 
3 cups sugar

1 1/3 cups evaporated milk
Position multi-purpose blade in 

work bowl. Add walnuts and pulse 
3 to 4 times to coarsely chop. Re 
move from bowl and set aside. Add 
figs to bowl. Pulse 5 to 6 times to 
coarsely chop. Remove from bowl 
and set aside.

Add chocolate , marshmallow 
creme, butter, and vanilla to bowl.

In a 3-quart saucepan, combine 
sugar and evaporated milk. Cook 
mixture over medium heat, stirring 
constantly, until mixture comes to a 
full rolling boil. Continue to cook, 
stirring constantly, until mixture 
reaches the soft ball stage (236°F).

With machine running, add milk 
mixture through feed tube in a 
steady stream, about 25 seconds. 
Continue processing until chocolate 
mixture has melted, an additional 
5 to 10 seconds.

Add walnuts and figs. Pulse 5 to 6 
times to combine.

Spread fudge into a 9 x 13-inch

buttered baking dish Cool com­
pletely. Cut into squares. Wrap and 
store in a cool place.

Yield: 3 pounds

Apricot Bon Bon Lollipops
1/2 cup walnuts

1 package (6 oz.) dried apricot
halves

1/2 cup powdered sugar
2 teaspoons light corn syrup
1 package (6 oz.) semisweet

chocolate bits
1/2 teaapooi short-'ning
1/4 c u p  chopped Wu.nuts or

toasted shredded coconut
Position multi-purpose blade in 

work bowi Add walnuts to bowl. 
Pulse 3 to 4 times to coarsely chop. 
Remove from bowl and set aside.

Add aprict ts, powdered sugar, 
and corn syrup to bowl. Process 
until mixture forms a ball, about 
25 seconds. Add walnuts and pulse 
3 to 4 times to combine.

Shape mixture into 12 balls and 
chill.

Melt chocolate and shortening in 
double boiler. Insert a bamboo 
skewer into each chilled ball. Rotate 
each in chocolate to coat. Dip lightly 
into chopped nuts or toasted coco­
nut. Place on baking sheet lined with 
waxed paper. Chill to set chocolate.

Yield: 12 lollipops

Dear Santa,
I’m going to be at my house. 

Please bring me some blocks 
and a Castle Grasco

Love, 
Michael Gore

Dear Santa,
I hope your reindeer are 

doing o.k. I want a toy and 
some colors. I’ll leave you a 
sandwich. And I want a book 
and some scissors. I want a 
record and some coloring books.

Love, 
Tobie Torres

Dear Santa,
I want you to bring me a 

dolly. I hope you come to my 
house. Thank you for giving me 
a special gift.

Love,
Sylvia Alvarado Treat your family and friends to homemade confections during the holidays.

TLC Helps W e a th e r W inter
Well-heeled men and women know 

that even shoes without a tongue tell 
plenty about the wearer. Winter 
doubles the challenge of keeping 
shoes and boots looking their best, 
but according to the shoe care 
experts at National Presto Industries, 
a few extra maintenance steps can 
help ward off the demons of snow, 
rain, ice and salt before they possess 
your soles.

Before stepping out in new leather 
boots or shoes, take time to water­
proof them properly. Don’t assume 
that the manufacturer has already 
done this. The time spent in shipping 
and storage can take its toll on a 
factory treatment, so it’s better to 
be safe than sorry. Use a transparent 
oil-based paste for oil tanned leather 
and a silicone spray on dark-colored 
chrome tanned leather. (Ask the 
salesman how your footwear has 
been treated.) Silicone will stain 
light colors and suede, so use 
specially made waterproofing prod­
ucts for these materials.

Shine your shoes every week to 
maintain a barrier between them and 
the elements. These frequent shoe- 
shines also help keep shoe leather 
soft and supple.

Though the mess associated with 
do-it-yourself shines used to be 
enough to make you want to kick the 
habit before it started, the Presto 
electric shoe polisher does the job 
neatly, effortlessly and professionally. 
By maintaining a light pressure with 
the edge of the rotating brush, the 
polisher buffs and polishes in one 
operation. Buffing brushes attach to 
and release from the Polisher auto­
matically, so fingers never need come 
in contact with wax or polish. In 
fact, the operation is so neat and 
simple that the Shoe Polisher can be 
kept in a desk drawer at work for 
quick touch-ups. This compact shoe 
polisher kit provides a power handle, 
two brushes, two polish applicators, 
and a convenient storage tray to hold 
the complete kit and polish.

While regular polishing is prob­
ably the single most important 
maintenance step, there are a few 
other shoe care tips to remember:

•  If shoes do get wet, let them 
dry naturally. Leather is a skin, and 
will become dried and cracked if 
placed in direct contact with a heat 
source.

•  Be sure shoes and boots are 
completely dried before waterproof­
ing. Don't waterproof too frequently; 
a good waxing is sufficient.

•  If shoes come in contact with 
salt or chemicals used to melt snow, 
clean immediately with an equal- 
parts vinegar/water solution. Clean 
mud-caked shoes with a good lather 
of saddle soap.

•  Use the tools of the trade. 
Shoe trees and a shoe horn will help 
keep footwear true to its original 
form. Shoe trees also help absorb

excess perspiration and moisture.
•  If linings become damp, 

sprinkle a little baking soda, borax or 
corn starch inside and let it sit 
overnight.

•  Wipe shoes with a soft cloth 
after each wearing and before 
polishing.

When it comes to shoe care, give

bad habits the boot. Proper main­
tenance makes shoes and boots 
look their best, last their longest, 
and reflect beautifully on the wearer.

For a free brochure containing 
more information on how to care for 
shoes write “Shoe Care Tips,’’ Presto, 
P.O. Box 1212, Eau Claire, WI 54702.

iM K U M
1 to 5 PM 

Until Christmas
For Your Shopping Convenience

p t o i p u t o  y o u n g
1015 W  2 n d  - P o rla lo s  s i r s
Grand & Main • Clovis
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A GOOD AD! •  •

Let us help you find your market! 
Our experienced ad takers can 
advise you how to “ tell all about 
it” in a low-cost classified ad.

CALL ONE O F OUR FRIENDLY 
AD-V/-SORS TODAY!

CALL CLASSIFIED 272-4536

Muleshoe &
Bailey County Journal s
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'd e a d l in e  f o r  c l a s s if ie d a d s

IS TUESDAYS AND FRIDAYS 
12:00 NOON

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion 

Per Word....$.15  
Minimum 

Charge....$2.30 
2nd Insertion 

Per Word....$.13 
Minimum 

Charge.... $2.00 
CLASSIFIED 

DISPLAY 
$1.70.... 

per column inch 
BLIND AD RATES 

50% more 
DEADLINES 

12 Noon Tues. 
for Thursday paper 

12 Noon Fri. 
for Sunday paper 

WE RESERVE THE 
THE RIGHT TO 

CLASSIFY REVISE 
OR REJECT ANY AD 
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS 

RUN ONCE

F 0R  RENT: 2 bed­
room house 10 miles 
S.W . M uleshoe on 
pavement. $200 
month. 272-5051 after 
five.
w4-5ls-tfc

RUIDOSO CHALET: 4 
Bedroom for rent by 
day, weekend, or 
weekly. Call 505-257- 
2622 or 915-943-4261. 
Owner Dr. Albertson. 
a4-49t-tfc

2700 SQ . ft. Outdoor 
basem ent. 320 W. 
Ave J 272-4737 
w8-50t-tfc

5. ARV FOR RENT

FOR RE NT-Large  1 
bedroom apartment 
available Jan. 1, 1985. 
Call 272-4754 after 
5:00 p.m. 
s5-50s-tfc

M ARY K A Y  Cos­
metics. Shop now for 
your Christinas select­
ions, Fret gift wrap­
ping, Free Compli­
mentary Facial call 

» Yolanda Bell Beauty 
Consultant 925-6664. 
bl-45t-tfc

SORRY I  have been 
out of touch. Ready to 
go back in business. 
Wanted old post cards 
and envelopes, and 
would like to buy, sell 
or trade postage 

t  stam ps. Call Mike 
Pugh at 272-3039 or 
come by 1628 W. 
Ave. B. 
pl-48t-9tc

FURNITURE Up­
holstering & Repairs 
Burrows Upholstery 
Shop 209 W. 2nd 
Phone 272-4255 Home 

§ Phone 272-5722. 
bl-41t-tfc
NEED A S S IS T A N C E  
filling out your in­
surance forms. For 
more information call 
Richelle King 272-
444Q
kl-50t-tfc _______

W ANT  to rent: 3 bed­
room house in the 
country or with a 
fenced back yard. Call 
246-3256 after 7:00 
p.m.

&T

Lose Weight, feel 
great. Look good for 
he holidays. AH 

natural, no drugs. 
More information 
call: 965-2866 Don’t 
Weight!

CONCERNED 
About Someone’s 

Drinking 
HELP IS 

AVAILABLE 
through Al-Anon 

Call 227-2350 or 
965-2870 or Call 
227-2350 or come to 
v is it  T u e s d a y  
nights. 8:00 p.m. at 
1116 W. Ajnerican 
Boulevard, M ule­
shoe

'ractors 
equip- 

pay, in- 
:k leave, 
id vaca- 
y Inter- 
iuleshoe, 
.514.

CITY  of Bovina 
tcepting applica- 

for certified 
:e officer from 
late through Jan.

1985. Send 
ne to City Ad­
oration Wayne 
rs Drawer KK, 
ia. Tx. 79009 or 
106-238-1116.

FOR SALE: By owner 
3-1-1 house on 1 acre 
3 miles N. of Mule­
shoe. 30’s 272-5042 
t8-47s-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bed­
room 219 W. 5th. Call 
272-5259 
8-51s-ltp
FOR SALE: 20 acres 
approximatley 2 miles 
from town. 20 H.P. 
electric irrigation well 
and underground 
ipe. Assumable 
exas Veteran Loan. 

Phone 272-5123. 
h8-51s-4tsc
FOR SALE: 1981 Art- 
craft 14 x 72 2
bedroom 2 bath 
Energy Saving Mobile 
Home. Masonite 
siding, central heat 
and air. All appli­
ances. Very good 
condition. Call 806- 
825-2730 in a.m. Good 
buy if sold in 2 weeks. 
Will then be taken off 
market.
8-51s-4tp
FOR SALE B Y  OWN­
ER 2-1-1 on 2 lots. All 
fenced yard, storage 
building, fruit trees. 
$17,500. Call 965- 
2320.
L8-41s-stfc

JIMMIE 
CRAWFORD 

Real Estate & Ins.
1725 W Ave E 

Muleshoe. Texas 
Phone 272-3666

3-1 Brick with tilel 
fence and garden.! 
1600 Sq. Ft. Good! 
price-$39,500.

3-1 »/j-2 Brick withl 
carport. Price re-1 
duced-$45,000.

2-1 : th fencedl
back d °30 Sq. Ft.J 
$26.06 .

2-1 with larw:-* util­
ity. 938 Sq. Ft. 
$17,500.

2 labors drylandl 
west of Enochs. lA \  
minerals.

160 acres west of| 
town wi*h 2 wells. 
Good price.

320 acres N.E. of| 
town with 3 wells. 
Good land.

154 acres west of 
town with 4 wells.

J.B. SUDDERTH
REALTY INC.

Drawer 887 
Farwell, Tx. 79325 
Ph. 806-481-3288

HAVE BUYERS
NEED LISTINGS
80 Acres, 2 wells. 1 
electric motor.
West of Mules h o e  
on highway. Owner 
says Sell!

480 Acres Irrigated 
with Circle Sprink­
lers, lays good, on 
highway-West of 
Muleshoe. Owner 
says Sell!

Good 320 acres 
with 2 circles 2-8 in 
w ells on highway 
South East of Laz- 
buddie. $975 per 
acre cash with circle 
sprinkler included.

Good 320 acres Irri­
gated, 2-8 in wells, 
located north of 
Texico on highway.

160 acres, 8 in well 
with circle sprink­
ler, good water .’.rea 
South East of Okla­
homa Lane cross­
roads.

160 acres, 2-8 in 
wells, underground 
pipe, lay* excellent 
South of Farwell on 
highway.

160 acres, 8 in well 
and 10 tower zim- 
matic circle sprink­
ler near Oklahoma 
Lane Farm Supply. 
Excellent financing.

Good investment. 
Best money making 
well stocked farm 
supply business in 
the area. Well esta­
blished strategically 
located on FM high­
way right in the 
heart of the best 
irrigated farm land 
in Parmer County. 
Great family opera­
tion. Included are 2 
beautiful 3 bedroom 
ranch style brick 
homes and several 
large steel barns. 
Owner says sell and 
will finance.

Excellent 171.5 
acres. 1-8 in well, 
1-6 in well, with 
electric motors near 
Lariat.

158 acres irrigated 
with seven tower 
valley sprinkler and 
a nice 3 bedroom, 2 
bath brick home on 
highway near Beck 
Gin

277 acres some irr 
igated, some grass 6 
miles north of 
Bovina. Priced to 
sell. Owner says sell 
immediately.

EXCELLENT 640 
acres; 6 good 8 inch 
wells: 3 late model 
circle sprinklers: 
located in 200 foot 
plus water area 
south of Pleasant

KREBBS REAL 
ESTATE  

1004 W. 6th 
Phone -272-3191 

Appraisals 
We Specialize 

In Farms 
And Ranches

20A Native Grass • 
Hwy 84

**#
150 A Good Red
Land-Lariat area.

***
Hog farm-complete- 
ly automatic, E. of 
Muleshoe-Terms.

**•
Builders Dream - 
Plotted lots - Ready 
to build on - Hwy 84 

•**
Large tract of dry 
land - S of Mule­
shoe.
8-45s-stfc

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE  

232 Main 
277-4818

3 B.R. Brick, 2 
Bath, 2 Car Garage, 
2 Storage Bldg. 
Central heat Re­
frigerated air, Fire­
place, Electric Gar­
age doer openers 
feu ■ 1 back vard. 
good location. Pric­
ed to Sell!

HENRY REALTY

111 W. Ave. B 
Muleshoe, Texas 

272-4581 
***

320 Acres with 
large beautiful 3 - 
Bedroom, 3 bath, 3 
car garage, spacious 
gameroom, central 
heating and air, 
underground sprink­
ler for yard 30’ x 
50’ shop for build-
ine. 5 wells.***
80 ACRES  with 6” 
well and 8” well, 
under ground pipe 
owner financing 
available. 7 miles
west of Muleshoe.

•**
160 ACRES with 2 
wells and 7 tower 
sprinkler near
Lazbuddie.***
38 Acres West of 
Muleshoe, 6 Inch 
Well, Sideroll, All
Wheat.

***
One Acre Sites for 
Home Construction. 
3 Miles of Mule­
shoe on HWY, 3 
lots remain.

***
Completely remod­
eled 2 Bed r o o m  
home, ideal first 
home, must see to 
appreciate. Nice lo­
cation with F.H.A. 
loan. ***
Apartment complex, 
mobile home park, 
vacant land for ex­
pansion. Terms a- 
vailable.
8-23t-tfc

9.AUT1 : 1 ; IV FOR SALE

1971 CHEVROLET 
3/4 ton. New trans­
mission. New tires. 
Call 946-3498. 
9-51s-2tp

FOR SALE  Ten all 
steel 8x9x24 ft. “ Big 
12” Cotton trailers. 
Five wood-wire,
8x8x20 “ Big 12” 
Cotton trailers. Ex­
cellent condition. Cali 
965-2693 at night.
w!0-42t-tfr

FOR SALE: A RCA 
VCR recorder $285 
Call 272-5151 
gl 1 -51 s-1 tc
FOR S A L E : Quail, 
Jumbo Northern Bob- 
white, Ringneck
Pheasants. Call now 
to stock land for next 
season. 925-6789 after 
5:00.
dll-51s-tfc
FOR SALE: Maple 
bunk beds. $75.00 
Call 965-2761. 
pi l-50s-tfc
High school youth are 
selling dry wood. 
Mesquite. Oak. Pinon, 
Call 238-1620 after 
5:00 p.m.

■si 1 -49s-6tc
FOR SALE Firewood. 
Dry Oak. 272-3987. 
wll-45s-tfc
FOR SALE: Used
35mm cameras--like 
new, various prices. 
Call 272-5151 
gl 1 -51s-1 tc
FOR SALE: Home­
made Cabbage Patch 
Dolls. 272-5212 
gl l-51s-3tc

FOR SALE: Big doll 
house, doll bed, chest 
of drawers, sewing 
machine, what-not- 
shelves, bookcases, 
other items, too 
numerous to mention. 
See anytime at 911 S. 
First.
w ll-51s-ltc

1983 HONDA GOLD 
Wing Aspencade, 
Wineberry. 4800 
miles. Call 825-3822 
Oklahoma Lane 
b 11 -51 s-tltc

H O M E  R E P A I R S .  
F.M. Saldana Con­
struction Licensed 
and bonded plumber. 
Specialize in cement, 
carpenter work, re­
modeling, painting, 
acoustical ceilings. 
272-4955.
15-16s-tfc
BRUCE & M A T ­
THEWS Inc. Refriger­
ation & Electrical 
Contractor’s Heating, 
Cooling. Applia nc e 
Service. 424 N. First. 
272-5114.
15-44t-tfc

WANTED to buy 
reasonable 1-2 Tube 
panel ray wall heater 
with working control. 
Call 272-3533. 
15-50s-6tp

WANT TO BUY  used 
3 bdrm house to be 
moved. Call Roy 
Whitt office 272-3611, 
home 272-3058. 
wl5-44s-stfc

18. UEGAL NOTICE

DAVIS
COMMERCIAL 

PUMPING 
SERVICE 

Cess pools. Grease 
pits. Dipping vats. 
M ud p its . Septic  
Tanks.

" I f  i t ’s part liquid 
and not over 20 foot 
deep we 'll try to 
drain i t . ' ’

806-272-4673 
806-272-3467 

Muleshoe, Texas 
15-39s-stfc ___

Notice is hereby given 
that Nick Bamert, 
heretofore doing
business as a sole 
proprietor under the 
name of Nick Bamert 
Farms, has ceased to 
continue such busi­
ness as a sole pro-

Erietorship and here- 
y gives notice that 

such business was 
transferred to a corp­
oration on October 1, 
1984 under the name 
of Nick Bamert 
farms, Inc. 
sl8-50t-4tc

* * * *

Work hard, die early 
--your family will enjoy 
your insurance.

* *  *  *

Smart business peo­
ple are now making their 
plans to get the Christ­
mas shopper’s cash.

Repair of home appliances and 
personal property, such as a watch or 
a camera, is now taxable under the 

state sales tax.
Additional city sales taxes 

may also apply.

For more information call 
toll free 1-800-252-5555.

Bob Bullock
Texas Comptroller of Public Accounts

79 MODEL Hesston 3000 Stripper, clean, 
$2500 ***
IH MODEL 95 Cotton Stripper $10,000 

***
!H MODEL 95 Cotton Stripper, Clean 
$12,500 ***
ONE IH MODEL 85 Stripper $500 

***
ONE 81 MODEL 1400 Stripper Recondi­
tioned & Clean $25,000 ***

Wooley International 
W. Hwy 84 

Muleshoe, Texas

wl0-44s-tfc

BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY 
116 E. Ave. C 

272-5285***272-5286

SHOWN B Y  APPOINTMENT ONLY-COUNTRY CHARM WITH CITY CONVENIENCE-Spacious 
4 Bdrm., 2 3/4 Bath, 2 Car Garage Brick Home. Beautifully Landscaped. Approx. 3570 sq. ft. of 
Lv. area. Dual Cent. A&H units, Cathedral beamed Den with cozy fireplace, large Game Room 
with portable bar, separate Living, Dining, & Breakfast areas. Nice kitchen with built-ins 
including BBQ Grill, large Utility Area with pantry & storage. Interior of home is trimmed in 
pecan wood & paneling & has nice enclosed entry-garden area. Other amenities include thermal 
windows, large covered patio with gas grill, undrgrd. sprinkler sys., nice workshop with heating 
& elect., & numerous other extras.

RICHLAND HILLS

3-1 3/4-1 Brick, Cent. A&H, stove DW, 
fenced yard. 40’s...

3-1 3/4-2 Brick with comer fireplace in 
den, built-ins, large sunny dining area
with built-in planter....

**•
LUXURY LIVING in this 3-2-2 Custom- 
built brick, loads of built-ins, wet bar, 
Jacuzzi, whirlpool, atruium, basement, 
Cent. A&H, & more...

***
REDUCED PRICE-3-1%-2 carport, Brick. 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, gas log fireplace, 
fenced yard. $48,000!!!!!!!

COUNTRY CLUB

3-1 3/4-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins. 
$40’s!!!l!

***
3-lVi-l Brick, repainted inside & out, 
built-in range, gas grill, storage bldg. Low
40’s!!!!!

1-1 3/4 Brick, C j i k |A ) l .  built-ins, 
pet, fenced y o "  u  more!!!!!

***
2-1-1 home on comer lot, close to schools. 
Priced to Sell!!!!!

***
EXTRA NICE-2 -lt l carport home, new 
paint, countertop, fenced yard & storage 
bldg. $19,500!!!!!

*•*
2-1 3/4 Mobile Home t  2 carport, covered 
porch, built-ins, cable TV. large barn & 
corrals on approx. 2 acres on pavement
close to town. 30’s ......• • •
OWNER F IN A N C IN G ^2t2 carport Mobile 
home, b u ilt-irvv \jV .c . A&H, utility, 
covered porch 'i^"age bldg., shop, fenced 
yard. Close to i-tnools!!!!!

***
Building on 2 lots, 
paved parking!!!!

approx. 2350 sq. ft.,
**•

carpet,
nice

LENAU ADD.

JUST LISTED-3-W*-\ carport home, nice 
carpet, fireplace, covered patio, storage 
bldg., isolated master bdrm.-$30's!!!!!

***
3-1-1 home on comer lot. 
Evap. air, fenced yard $30’s.

Cent, heat.

***
3-1 3/4-1 carport, nice carpet, fenced yard, 
a neat well-kept home. 30’s!!!!

*•*
ENJOY COUNTRY LIVING-3-1 V* home on 
2'/j acres on pavement close to town.
Cent. A&H. built-ins, & other extras!!!!! 

***
3-1-1 home, comer lot. 
A&H. nice carpet. 30’s....

built-ins, Cent.
***

2-1 home on 1 acre, built-ins, nice carpet
& located on pavement close to town......

• • •
HIGH SCHOOL AREA- 3-1 home, new 
roof, carpets. & interior paint, built-in 
DW, large rooms, & also has nice 
insulated workshop. S20*s!!!!!!!

FARMS

60 acres dryland, close to town....
***

80 acres, Stegall area. Good productive 
dryland farm....

***
2-1 home on 20 acres, 20 hp. sub. pump, 
domestic well, large bam & corrals, Vi
mile sprinkler pipe, & more. $42,500....

***
2-1 home on 32 acres, 6” well, close to 
town on pavement....

*«*
120 acres-good 6“ well, good farm, close 
to town. $700 per acre....

•**
1062 acres, 3 wells. 2 circles, large metal
barn, 9% Owner financing......

*«*
160 acres, well with 40 hp. Elec, motor. 
$400 per acre......

JUST LISTED-320 acres good cultivated 
land, near Stegall area in Roosevelt 
County, N.M.-S250 per acre....

•**

Wc have numerous other farms, 
commerical property. & lots listed. Contact 
us for details on these and other listings. 

*•*

“ WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS” 
GEORGE NIEMAN. BROKER 
DIANNE NIEMAN. BROKER 8-40-stfc
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Dear Santa Claus,
This is what I want for 

Christmas. I have been very

f;ood this whole year. I would 
ike My Little Pony, a computer, 

a little pony, a cat, a dog, a 
crystal ring, a lot of pretty 
earrings, and a Care Bear.

Bye Santa Claus 
Love Always 

Jina Saenz 
Merry Christmas 

Santa Claus

Dear Santa,
I’ve been good all year and 

hope you will come to my 
house. 1 want doll furniture, 
stuffed puppy, bald headed 
cabbage patch kid, barbie, 
three-wheeler, and a theodore 
(the chipmunk). 1 will leave you 
some ice cream sandwich. I 
Love You So Much. My phone 
number is in the book.

Love, 
Stacy Harlan

Dear Santa,
You are a Merry Santa, and 1 

want a Dukes of Hazzard, 
Cowboys and indians. Then I 
want a Battlecat and He-Man. 
I’ve been good and 1 brush my 
teeth when my mom tells me to. 
That is all 1 want. Thank you.

I love you 
Colby Latham

Dear Santa,
I want everything of 

“ Maters of the Universer’ and a 
Knight Rider car. My brother 
wants all the collection of 
Transformers. My other brother 
wants the collection of GI Joe, 
and Return of the Jedi. 1 have 
been a very good boy. I also 
want clothes. 1 like you.

Love
Mario Pedroza

Dear Santa,
1 want my Little Pony and a 

Cabbage Patch Doll. My little 
brother wants Gremlins. 1 have 
been good and so has my 
brother. I love you.

Bye
Melissa Mata

Dear Santa,
I want a Knight Rider 

motorcycle; My sister wants a 
Rainbow Brite. My daddy wants 
a watch. My mama wants some 
earrings. 1 will leave you some 
cookies.

Love, 
Wayne Wallace

Dear Santa,
I’m sorry I cried when 1 came 

to see you. Please bring me a 
tractor like Daddy’s and a 
Bedtime Ernie. I will leave you 
some cookies. 1 have tried to be 
good this year.

Love, 
Jeffrey King

Dear Santa,
I want a puzzle and a Smurt. 

I will leave you a strawberry to 
eat. I’ve been good this year.

Love, 
Jennifer Rojas

Dear Santa,
I want a doll that cries and 

laughs, a Cabbage Patch doll, 
some Cabbage patch shoes and 
some clothes. I hug your picture 
on my door. I have been a good 
girl too. Bring my brothers and 
my sister something. They have 
tried to be good too. Bye,

I Love you 
Heather Jaramillo

Dear Santa,
I want some play money and 

a dog (a play dog). I want a 
He-man and some elephant 
slippers and some clothes. 1 will 
leave you a ham sandwich when 
you come. 1 also want a stuffed 
bear. My sister wants a doll. 
My sister and 1 have been real 
good.Two more thing for my 
sister - a beauty shop and a 
Barbie on a horse.

I love you, 
Jaime Zamora

Dear Santa,
1 want a gun for Christmas so 

please give it to me. These are 
the things 1 want - a handgun, a 
He-man sword, and a pellet 
gun. I have a glass Santa for 
you.

Love, 
Jake Caswell

Dear Santa,
Thank you for telling you to 

give me a present. 1 want a 
Cabbage Patch doll, and a bike. 
That’s all. 1 want you to get my 
little sister a cabbage Patch doll 
too and a little bike cause she is 
a baby.

1 want to see you soon. Your 
reindeers are pretty. Thank you 
for giving us a Christmas tree. I 
love you.

Crystal Orozco

Dear Santa,
1 want this little plastic purse 

that has make-up in it. I want 
an 1-love-you Barbie doll and a 
Love-you Pony. Please bring me 
a stamper. I’ll leave you Oreo 
cookies and some milk. Bring 
my sisters some toys, too. I’ve 
been real good. So has my 
sister. Bring a little gown for 
my cousin.

Love, 
Sarah Reynolds

Dear Santa,
I want a Cabbage Patch Kid.

I want you to come to my 
Grandma's house early. My 
brother wants a little tractor or 
some candy.

Love, 
Kristen Nichols

Dear S?.nta,
1 want a doll. 1 have been 

very good this year. Please 
bring me a book. I will leave 
you some chocolate chips.

I love you, 
Misti Williams

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 

Patch Kid and a basket. I also 
want the baby that crawls. I will 
leave you some cookies. I’ve 
been good. I also want a 
bicycle. 1 love you Santa!

Love, 
Heather Fuller

Dear Santa,
I am six years old and in 

kindergarten. I want a Crystal 
Ken and a play oven and a pair 
of skates. And a motor bike for 
Barbie. My brother Cade is one 
year old. He wants a rocking 
horse. We will leave you some 
cookies and milk.

Love,
Heather Hooten

Dear Santa,
I want a remote control 

airplane and I want a x-mas 
Mickey Mouse record. And I 
want a little present under my

tree. 1 will leave you cooKies 
and milk. And I want a dollar.

Love,
Taylor Robinson

Dear Santa,
I want a jet of G.I. Joe and a 

bike and a He-man. Please send 
me a Castle Grasco. I’ve been 
good this year.

Love, 
Johnny Flores

Dear Santa,
1 want the Superman

Collection and the GI Joe 
Collection. I will leave you some
Cocoa.

Love, 
Justin St. Clair

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I want a bike a 

He-Man and also, I want a two 
by two a Supermen, and a 
Mighty Gobot. Thank you. Kind 
sir.

Merry Christmas, 
Jua Rivera

Dear Santa
I would like a GI Joe boat and 
He man and Skeletare and a 
cobra con fistoe, Strideore, 
attack track, Aquaman and an 
erecktoo that is all Merry 
chrismas Love Dink Pitcock

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Cabbage 
Patch Kid with yellow hair and 
some clothes.

Merry Christmas, 
Belynda Waddell

Dear Santa
I want a race track and a 

model airplane.
Merry Christmas, 
Jon Colby Miller

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a medical kit 

and a Pac-Man game and 
Hungry, Hungry Hippo game
and clothes.

Merry Christmas, 
Ivette Reyes

Dear Santa,
For Christmas, I want a 

Cabbage Pach Kid and a 
computer and discs for it and 
clothes and a toy car.

Merry Christmas, 
Timmy Smith

Dear Santa,
I want a hungry, hungry 

hippo game and a Dream 
Dancer and a maeical musical 
thing and a care bear skates 
and a Great Barbie doll.
Merry Christmas 
Joanna Gallman

Dear Santa,
I want a race track and a bike 

and a BMX motorcycle.
Merry Christmas,
RaKKw wtti

Dear Santa
Please bring me a B-B gun and 
a Pear of B-Bs will be careful 
with and a base and a 
motorcycle

Merry Christmas, 
Chris Everett

Dear Santa,
I want a rel three wheeler and 

a radio and a race track
Merry Christmas, 

Pete Gallegos

Dear Santa
I want a real Cabbage patch 
Kid, a tree, Miss piggy dall a 
Care Beai, and a toy bug.

Merry Christmas 
Stormy Davison

Dear Santa,
1 want a Cabbage Patch Kid, 

baby nursey set, radio, three
wheeler .

Merry Christmas, 
Jennifer Winders

Dear Santa,
For Christmas 1 want a 

cabbage Patch Kid and a 
Rainbow Brite and a Care Bear 
and a My Little Pony

Merry Christmas 
Glorya Vargas

Dear Santa,
I want a real radio, bike a Care 
Bear, and a Cabbage patch Kid.

Merry Christmas, 
Trina Orozco

Dear Santa,
I want a real motorcytie and a 
bike and a Atari and a radio and ^  
a Pac Man Game. w

Merry Christmas,
Nick Hinojosa

Dear Santa,
I want a great big play bear 

and a bike and a shoes
Merry Christmas, santa,

Alma Alcala
I Love you, Santa.

Dear Santa,
1 will like a Bigfoot put with *  

batteries and a three wheeler 
and a break dance pants and a 
stereo with a cassette that you 
can remote and a Gobot and a 
remote-controlled airplane and a 
pac-man watch

Merry Christmas 
Gabriel Valencia .

BARGAIN
O F  T H E  M O N T H

nvitimvm
VALUE

o r  n i l ;  MONTH

While
Supplies Lest

5-Pc. Completer Set
Includes frost w h ite  1 2 ^ - i n .  
serving platter, 2 -q t  bowl, cov­
ered sugar and creamer 

QUANTITIES LIMITED

While 
Supplies 

Last

Fan-Forced 
Electric Heater
P uts warmth where you need it! 
Auto temp, control, 3 6 0 °  tip- 
over shutoff 1320 W  H R 10B  

QUANTITIES LIMITED

Fry & Co9 .

Special Year End SALE!!!!!
On 1984 Model P&R Surge Valves

New 8” Units

Reconditioned Units

*1000
*790

These are offered only on a first come basis and there is a very limited supply. The 1985 models 
will be available soon and P&R wants to liquidate their present inventory quickly!!!!

These units are high quality two program systems with complete warranty. The unit is cast 
aluminum with controls sealed in a mounted casing. The electronic imicroprocessor is simple to 
program and displays the exact irrigation sequence. The efficient design diverts water with a 
minimum of turbulance and no back pressure.

See or call Pivot Products today lo take advantage of this fantastic sale!!!

Pivot Products Inc.
W. Hwy 84 2 7 2 -5 5 3 6

*

0

A
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Save Thousands on new 
John Deere Equipment. . .  now!

John Deere has given us tremendous allowances on new 
equipment and we're passing those saving on to you. In 
addition to that there are many finance waiver discounts 
to sweeten the pot. Stop in now and choose your deal.

DEAL 1. 4WD TRACTORS
Thousands of dollars in pass-along savings on every new John 
Deere 4WD tractor in stock. No interest until June 1, 1985, with 
John Deere financing * Or, in lieu of the finance waiver take 
these extra discounts.

DISCOUNT IN LIEU OF WAIVER

DEAL 3. UTILITY TRACTORS
Get unheard of savings that we're passing along from John 
Deere on new Utility tractors shown in this chart. Then, get 
interest-free John Deere financing until June 1, 1985 
Or, take an additional discount in lieu of finance waiver

MODEL D uring  DEC During JA N D uring  FEB

8450 $2100 $1725 $1350
8650 2575 2100 1625
8850 3225 2625 2050
8440 1725 1400 1100
8640 2125 1725 1350

MODEL CUSTOMER DISCOUNT
40-hp 1250 $ 550
50-hp 1450 625
60-hp 1650 700
45-hp 2150 650
50-hp 2 2 5 5 * * ................................ 675
55-hp 2350 750
65-hp 2550 850
75-hp 2750 1400

2750 High Clearance 1000
85-hp 2950 2700

Outstanding savings on used 4WD tractors, too. with no interest 
to pay until June 1, 1985, with John Deere financing.*

DEAL 2. ROW CROP TRACTORS
Huge pass-along savings on units listed here plus interest-free 
financing until June 1, 1985 * If you prefer, take an extra dis­
count in lieu of finance waiver

DISCOUNT IN LIEU OF WAIVER

Used equipment also qualifies for the same interest free John 
Deere financing offer

DEAL 4. COMBINES
The John Deere combines listed here are offered at fabulous 
off-season savings Thousands of dollars off PLU S IN TE R E S T  
FR EE FIN AN CIN G  T O  TH E  FIR ST O F  T H E  1985 USE 
S EA S O N  These prices apply when the combine is purchased 
with new header equipment
MODEL CUSTOMER DISCOUNT

MODEL D uring  DEC D uring  JAN D uring  FEB

100-hp 4050 $1000 $ 825 $ 650
120-hp 4250 1075 875 700
140-hp 4450 1200 975 750
165-hp 4650 1450 1175 925
190-hp 4850 1675 1375 1075

SERIAL  #600000 SERIAL  #600001
TO

A N D  BELO W  SERIAL *6 1 0 0 0 0  
4420 $ 5,000 $ 3,500
6620 5,000 4,000
6620 (SIDEHILL) 6,000 4.500
6622 10,000 7,000
7720 7,000 4.500
7721 , 4,000 2.500
8820_________________________ 10,000 ____  5,500

Huge savings with the same Deere financing interest-free offer 
on used equipment, also

If a new head or platform is purchased independent from the 
separator, a $1.000 discount will apply If the separator is sold 
without new header equipment, the discounts will be reduced 
by $1,000

Don't delay! Come in and make the deal of your choice
• Availability ol John D w i  financing iub|#ct to approval oi c radii Thoaa 
often may bo withdrawn at any lima 

*' This modal is not available in Nebraska

0

1516 W. Amer. Blvd.
Dent - Rempe

401 S. 1st. 272-4511 272-4296


