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Local, Area Schools Honor Students
Lazbuddie, 
Three Way 
Name ‘Best *

.  LAZBUDDIE
Lazbuddie School has re­

leased the names of the 
valedictorian and salutatorian 
for the 1986 graduating class.

Valedictorian will Tbe Aaron 
Hargett, son of Arnold and 
Mary Archer of Lazbuddie.

Aaron played football and 
participated in track. He is a 
m em ber of National Honor 

^  Society, has been a Student 
Council member, president of 
the senior class, president of 
FFA and Mr. LHS. His four 
year grade point average is 95.

Melissa Sanchez, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Evaristo Sanchez 
of Lazbuddie. is salutatorian. 
She has a grade point average 
of 92.5.

Melissa has participated in 
/  FHA, National Honor Society, 

Student Council representative, 
track, and has been a regional 
qualifter for the past three 
years, and a varsity cheerleader 
during her junior and senior 
years.

THREE WAY
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MULESHOE King Valedictorian; 

Harris Salutatorian

AARON HARGETT 
VALEDICTORIAN

BRETT STEGALL 
VALEDICTORIAN

WADE KING 
VALEDICTORIAN

Sandra P. Graves of Mule­
shoe graduated from Sul Ross 
State University during sprino 
commencement.

^  Graves received her bachelor 
or arts  degree in politcal 
science. She is the daughter of 
Willie Mae Graves of Muleshoe. 

***
Four students from Muleshoe 

were among 603 South Plains 
College students at Levelland 
who received diplomas and 
certificates during SPC’s 28th 
graduation ceremonies May 10 

g in Texan Dome.
Recipients were Shonda Kaye 

Chancey and Rhonda Graham, 
certificates of proficiency, voca­
tional nursing; Preston Lang­
ford, associate in applied 
science* mid-management; and 
Jimmy Watson, AAS, petroleum 
technology.

***
Jimmy Watson has received a 

§ departmental award in petro­
leum technology during a recent 
assembly at South Plains Col­
lege, Levelland.

Faculty m em bers selected 
outstanding students in each 
department, based on scholar­
ship and academic leadership, 
according to Orlo Sundre, SPC 
dean of arts and sciences.

Watson is the son of Mr. and 
•  Mrs. Delbert Watson and his 

wife if Sandy Watson, all of 
Muleshoe.

***
Debbie Hart, daughter of 

Holly Millsap and Ted Millsap 
of Muleshoe, and a student at 
Texas Tech University, Lub­
bock, is recipient of a scholar­
ship for Home Economics for 

0  the fall semester.
Her scholarship is a Business 

Scholarship for Leadership.
She is also on the Dean’s 

Honor List for the w inter 
semester at Tech.

***
According to a survey made 

by the Mulcsoe Chamber of 
Commerce and Agriculture, the 
following businesses will be 

% open Monday. Memprial Dav:
A&M Farm & Ranch Supply. 

Anthony’s. Bingham & INieman, 
C & H Equipment, Chick-N- 
Dock. Famous Fashions. Joe’s 
Boot Shop, McCormick Seed, 
Pay-N-Save; Pizza Hut, Shafer’s 
Gas Station and ServAll Thrift­
way.

And Alex’s Tire Service, Ben 
Franklin. Tom Bonds DDS. 

^  Dairy Queen, Fair Store. Fry & 
Cox, K-Bob’s. Muleshoe IGA, 
Perry Brothers. Poynor's Otasco 
Store, Sonic Drive-In and Town 
& Country Stores.

***
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MELISSA SANCHEZ 
SALUTATORIAN

MARCUS HUFF 
SALUTATORIAN

MIKE HARRIS 
SALUTATORIAN

Watson Junior High Students 
Receive Awards At Assembly

Ben Gramling acted as master 
of ceremonies for the Watson 
Junior High School awards 
program Wednesday morning.

Andy Langfitt was named 
‘Mr. WJHS’ and Lisa Triana 
was chosen ‘Miss WJHS’ with 
Tisha Young being named 
‘Outstanding Girl' and Cary 
Skaggs ‘Outstanding Boy.

Other awards wer given as 
follows: Gloria Gilliam. Special 
Education; Noel Vourazeris, 
English 8; Adclaido Godinez. 
Spelling 8; Candy Tigue, Eng­
lish 7; Steve Garcia. Spelling 7; 
Virgil ’Snell, English 6; and 
Steven Noble. Spelling 6.

And, Walter Lackey, Social 
Studies 8; Burnlev Riley, Social 
Studies 7; Dawn Taydor, Social 
Studies 6; Robert Nunez, Read­
ing 8; Collin Robison, Reading 
7; Angie Krey, Reading 6; Amy 
Montgomery, Science 8; Brandi 
Estep, Science 7; and Lashelle 
Scoggin, Science 6.

Mike Shields. Computer Lit­
eracy; Jason Fuller, Math 8; 
Steve Garcia. Math 7; Galin 
Latham, Math 6; Michelle 
Finney, Band 8; Hector Flores, 
Band 7; Alex Gregory, Band 6; 
Jimmy Johnson, Art 8; Stacy 
Knowlton, Art 7; and Shea 
Wilbanks, Art 6.

MHS Seniors Joining 
Project Graduation

M uleshoe High School is 
among 33 high schools in West 
Texas whose seniors this year 
will enjoy an alcohol-free and 
drug-free alternative to the 
traditional parties where alcohol 
is allowed, that in the past have 
been an accepted form of 
celebration following gradua­
tion, Mel Pope, District Engi­
neer. State Dcpartent of High­
ways and Public Transportation 
in Lubbock, announced. The 
celebration is also called ‘Pro­
ject Graduation.’ Muleshoe held 
such a party in 1985.

Muleshoe seniors arc plan­
ning a trip to the student union 
building at Eastern New Mexico 
University at Portalcs, and will 
return to Muleshoe about 5 a.m. 
for breakfast in Muleshoe. Last 
year, the group had their 
celebration in the Texas Tech 
Recreation Center in Lubbock.

“ Most of the communities 
who have accepted the alcohol- 
free and drug-free alternative 
this year know how nice it is for 
their young people to have a 
great time at graduation without 
drugs and alcohol, because 22 
of these same high schools had 
such a celebration last year,” 
Pope continued.

There arc 90 Project Gradua­
tion celebrations throughout 
Texas in 1985 according to 
statistics reported to the SDH &

PT by the schools.
The term Project Graduation 

and the concept started in 
Maine, in 1980, when horror got 
the attention of parents and 
schools. Eleven people were 
killed in one weekend on Maine 
highways, and all 11 deaths 
were alcohol related. Shortly 
following this tragic weekend 
was the graduation season, and 
one school district in Maine 
almost matched that figure. In 
one community alone, seven 
young people were killed in 
alcohol related accidents, and 
one wound up paralyzed and 
comatose. Several others were 
arrested for operating under the 
influence-all in the two weeks 
before graduation. It got peo­
p le 's  a tten tion . The Project 
Graduation concept has spread 
to other high schools in Maine, 
and now no young people are 
killed during graduation time in 
Maine in automobile crashes. 
Since that time the concept has 
spread all over the United 
States.

In 1984 two high schools in 
Texas had Project Graduation 
events. These high schools were 
Monterey High School in Lub­
bock and DcValle High School 
near Austin. Monterey High 
School had their ali night
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Walter Lackey, Speech 8; 
Misty Ott, Speech 7; Jackie
Luna, Girls PE 8; Ella Wilder- 
son. Girls PE 7; Tory Matthews, 
Girls PE 6; Wendy Green, Girls 
Athletics 8 and Monica Swint, 
Girls Athletics 7.

Ramon Sigala, Boys PE 8;
Jesus Martinez. Boys PE 7;
David Quintana, Boys PE 6;
Chris Perez, Boys Athletics 8 
and John Orozco, Boys Athletics 
7.

PERFECT ATTENDANCE 
SIXTH GRADE 

Abel Barron, Jorge Barron, 
Mita Bhakta, Cynthia Chavez, 
Connie Flores, Larry Jaramillo, 
Galin Latham. Antonio Marrufo, 
Steven Noble. Margarita Posa­
das, Misty Sawyer and Celia 
Villalobos.

SEVENTH GRADE 
Josue Barron. Norma Diaz, 

Blain Ferris, Lawrence Franco, 
Gary Freeman, Sheila Garner, 
Lilly Garza, Frank Leal, Victor
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Silver-Haired
Election Slated 
Next Friday

With one position to be filled 
from this area, balloting for the 
Silver Haired Legislator will be 
conducted on Thursday. May 
30, at the Aging Services office 
at the Bailey County Courthouse 
in Muleshoe, says Glen Wil­
liams. Aging Services coordina­
tor.

Absentee balloting concluded 
on Friday for the position to be 
filled by one of two announced 
candidates. W.A. Legion and 
Nathan Tubb.

th e  duo made a joint appear­
ance at the AARP meeting on 
Friday, and Tubb will speak to 
the Bailey County Senior Citi­
zens in the Methodist Church 
on Monday, May 26.

The Silver Haired Legislature 
is a forum created . by and 
latterned after the Texas Lcgis- 
aturc to provide formal and 
structured involvement of the 
senior citizens of Texas in

Wade King and Mike Harris 
have been named valedictorian 
and salutatorian of the 1986 
graduating class of Muleshoe 
High School. King has an 
overall grade point of 4.1 and 
Harris has attained a grade t 
point of 4.0.

Library Plans 
Reading Club 
Registration

“ Celebrate Texas” will be the 
theme of the 1986 Summer 
Reading Club at the Muleshoe 
Area Public Library, according 
to Anne Camp, librarian.

Registering will begin as soon 
as school is out on May 28, will 
continue all day on May 29.

Mrs. Camp said all boys and 
girls, first through fifth grade, 
of the Muleshoe area are invited 
to participate in the summer 
program.

‘Texas and the W est’ will be 
used in displays, programs, 
awards and prizes. Certificates 
from the Texas State Library, 
who co-sponsors the summer 
program, will be given for 
reading and reporting at least 
10 books, as well as other 
aw ards if the program  is 
continued to July 3.

Small children must be ac­
com panied by a parent to 
register, and Mrs. Camp said. 
“ We again ask all parent’s 
cooperation by seeing that their 
child reads every book report­
ed .”

Every Thursday, special acti­
vities will be held from 10:30 
a.m .-12 noon for the youngsters 
in the Reading Club, and Mrs. 
Camp said every effort has been 
made for these fun get-toget­
hers with contests, games and 
sing-alongs, as well as special 
guests, all designed to enhance 
the interest in ‘Texas: Past and 
Present.’

The ‘Go-Fer’ box will be filled 
with treats that can be earned. 
These Treats are being fur­
nished by the merchants and 
business people of Muleshoe.

The librarian said apprecia­
tion goes to the following 
contributors: Sonic Drive-In; 
Pay And Save Grocery; Perry’s; 
Spudnut Shop; Mule Putt Golf 
Course; Ben Franklin’s; Fry & 
Cox, Inc.; Leal’s; Gordon Wil­
son Appliance; Pizza Hut; 
Tropical Sno and Poynor’s.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe King are 
Wade’s parents, and he has 
attended Muleshoe schools for 
all of his schooling. His primary 
ex tracurricu lar activities and 
interests in high school have 
included football, tennis and 
lamb showing. He also has been 
an active member in clubs and 
organizations such as FCA, 
FTA, Student Council, SCAC 
and NHS.

Wade especially enjoys work­
ing with computers, and this 
year, he qualified as an alter­
nate on the team that partici­
pated in the state computer 
problem-solving contest.

He will be attending Texas 
University in the fall, with 
tentative plans to seek a degree 
in com puter science. King 
stated that Coach Jerry Robin­
son has been very influential in 
his life because “ He has 
always been like a friend to the 
guys.”

Harris, also a lifetime resi­
dent of Muleshoe, is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Royce Harris. 
While in high school, he 
participated in basketball and 
tennis for four years and has 
been a member of NHS, FCA, 
Student Council, and FTA.

His major interests academi­
cally are math and computers, 
and he plans to attend North 
Texas State University and 
major in radio/TV/film.

Mike stated that Tom Smith, 
a retired MHS math teacher, 
had been influential in his life 
and sparked his interest in math 
because of his ability to relate 
to his students, not only as a 
teacher, but as a friend. Harris 
attended the state contest as a 
member of the computer pro­
blem-solving team.

Other awards which were 
given at the annual MHS 
awards assembly, which was 
held W ednesday, May 21, 
include:

Juanita Garcia, All-Around 
Girl and Mike Holt, All-Around 
Boy, as Leslie Langfitt was 
named Best Girl Citizen and 
Rod Muyshondt was named 
Best Boy Citizen.

While Loy Triana received the 
Student Council Award and 
Stacy Smith was presented the 
Cheerleader Award.

The 1985-86 edition of the 
MHS Yearbook was dedicated to 
George Washington, who is 
retiring at the end of this school 

, year after 28 years with the 
» Muleshoe School system.

Other awards presented in­
cluded: Delta Kappa Gamma
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Washington Will Retire 
From School System

Cont. Page 6. Col. I

“ George Washington Slept 
Here,” is a popular expression, 
especially on the East Coast-but 
they sure don’t have ‘anything 
on Muleshoe. Not only has 
George Washington slept here, 
but he has lived here, and 
worked here for the past 28 
years.

And, now, after 28 years with 
the Muleshoe Independent 
School System, George Wash­
ington is retiring at the end of 
this school year. Most of his 
years with the school have been 
as a coach, and later as a 
physical education instructor.

With the passing of the years, 
Washington, or ‘Coach Wash­
ington,' as he is still affection­
ately known, has taught many 
younsters, and now he says he 
is beginning to teach, or has 
already seen the children of 
some of his first students, 
graduate.

For instance, before coming 
to Muleshoe, Washington was 
athletic director and head coach
at Lazbuddie for two years. 
While at Lazbuddie. he had 
Glen Watkins, and later had 
both Watkins’ sons, Randy and 
Gary, in the Muleshoe Schools. 
Both have since graduated from 
MHS.

Before he crossed the ‘Big 
Red' out of Oklahoma into

Texas, he spent two years at 
Guymon, Okla. as assistan t 
coach; this was followed by one 
year at Wakita. Okla. as athletic 
director before going to Wayne, 
Okla. for one year as athletic 
director.

After coming to Muleshoe 
from Lazbuddie. he was assis­
tant coach and junior high 
school coach under Wayne 
Mantooth and Bill Taylor, who 
is also re tiring  from the 
Muleshoe schools this year.

Cont. Page 6. Col. 3

GEORGE WASHINGTON
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M U L E S H O E
402 Main Street Muleshoe, Texas

DATE EFFECTIVE SUNDAY, MAY 25 THRU WEDNESDAY. MAY 28. 1986

TABLERITETABLERITEG E r  TABLERITE BEEF

Ham burger 
I  Patties

B eef Skirt 
Fajitas

jT-Bone
"Steak

LB.
ONLY

LB.
ONLY

LB.
ONLY

KRAFTKRAFT

Miracle1
UNSWEETEN

M i r a c l e
Whip., BARBBGUIM?’

sSAUaJlY"

BELL SUPER PROTEIN BELL DAIRY COKE IS IT!

Butterm ilk

ARMOUR 
CORN BEEF

Hash
CRISP & FRESH

Lettuce f  VINE RIPE

Tomatoes

LB ^  ONLY f

GOLD BOND SUPER SAVERS
WITH ONE FILLED GOLD BOND SUPFR SAVER BOOKLETWITH ONE Fll LED GOLD BOND SUPER SAVER BOOKLET WITH ONE FILLED GOLD BOND SUPER SAVER BOOKLET

FOR ALL YOUR BAKING NEEDS

©  Sugar White Bread

1 */2 LB. ' 
LOAF 9LARGE

WITH ONE. FILLED GOLD BOND SUPER SAVER BOOKLE1

ALL ASSORTED FLAVORS

- 7i £3 Ice Cream
WITH ONE FILLED GOLD BOND SUPER SAVER BOOKIE

RAINBOW

k Soft Drinks

>/2 GAL. 
SQUARE

BOX

DOZEN
CTN. 2 LITER 

BTL.
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DINE-A-MITE
Hybrid Sorghum-Sudangrass

Wiedebush & Company

Save up to 3 3 %  
Women’s shorts

sale Or 3  for * 2 0
9 M en. For summer fun try these shorts from 
n y  or RLVP In a blend of polyester-cotton to 
cool a nd looking fresh In solids for sires 9-18

Save up to 3 3 %
Knit tops for women

sale Or 3  for * 2 0
Reg. *.99 each. Choose from a variety of knit tops. M ade 
from a  cool blend of polyester-cotton In stripes and solids 
for misses sizes S.M.L.

ncNKsaaoi) Quality and Low Price* are port of tha bargain!

irkk  ANTHONY’S 64TH ANNIVERSARY
Memorial Day Sale

Boys’ tube socks and girls’ 
sport socks

sale 6  FO R  ^ 5
Girts' socks, Reg. 3 for 2.79 and 3 for 2.99. Boys' tube socks,
Reg. 6 for 5.4* and * for 5.99. Boys' tube socks and girls' 
sport socks are m a d e  from cotton-acrylic blend to absorb 
moisture. Boys' sizes 6-814 an d  8-11. girls' sizes 6-8V4 and 9-11.

Save on plush Cannon' 
bath towels

O r 1 0  for 1 9 97sale
Reg. 2.97 each. Add a touch of color to your bath at 
savings Cannon's'* soft bath towels are m ade from thick 
100\ cotton to wrap you up In luxury. In your choice of a 
wide range of colors to mix and m atch Slightly imperfect.

272-4611 Muleshoe

and tops for boys and girls

s a * » 2 O T a n d 3 "
4#7

-------» *■-------ooy* ana gins tops

sale " sale
Boys’ and O lds’ Shorts, Bays’ and Olds’ Shorts, 
Shtss 2 -4 T , 4 -6x, 4 -7  Sbtes 7 -1 4  and 8 -1 8
Tope, Rag. 3.49 fo 4.99. Short*, Reg. 5.99 to 8.99. Choose 
from "Street Baggies" shorts and assorted tops In fun prints 
a nd bright solids In polyester-cotton blends for easy care

Infants’ & toddlers’ sunsults, 
popo vers or short sets

097
m m  Reg. 3.49

Choose from popovers trimmed with lace for Infant girls, 
woven sunsults with detachable toys for Infant boys and 
girls, diaper shirts for newborns and 2-pc. short sets decorat­
ed with appliques for toddlers In easy care blends.

( ] J { P  Participants
We have an inexpensive

Sorghum-Sudangrass Cover Crop 
for your accepted CRP acres.

1. Three-Way Cross

2. Heavy Foliage

3. Drought Tolerant

4. Fast Growth

5. Noxious Weed Free

M EM BER 1 9 8 6TA
EX AS PRESS ASSOCIATION

Attention

Rebekah Lodge

HAPPY BIRTHDAY— Lowry Lewis was the only resident ot the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home to celebrate a birthday during the month 
of May. He was honored with a birthday party Thursday afternoon 
in the day room of the nursing home. The Needmore Community 
Club hosted the event and Muleshoe Floral provided the flowers. 
Lewis was born on May 25, 1900.

dismissed with a prayer by 
Clara Coffman.

Those present included; Dora 
Barber. Eva Ashford. Clara 
Coffman. Rose Martin. Pearl 
Dunlap and Wenona Spears.

Mrs. Spears reported that 
they had a nice day and they 
felt that the Lord blessed them.

SHOWER HONORS COUPLE—The home of Mrs. Nelson Carlisle 
was the scene of a pre-nuptial shower on Sunday. May 18 for Miss 
Amy Grimes of Lubbock, bride-elect of Mike Adrian of Petersburg. 
Hostesses for the occasion were Mrs. Don Parker, Mrs. Mel 
Ridgeley, Mrs. Bo Chunn. Mrs. Don Lowe, Mrs. Bobby Foley, 
Mrs. Jack Lane, Mrs. Caton Tyson, Mrs. Jack Reeves, Mrs. 
Mickey Sowder and Mrs. Carlisle. Miss Grimes and Adrian will 
exchange wedding vows Friday, June 6 at the First United 
Methodist Church in Petersburg,

the fourth of Julv booth.
Refreshments were served by 

Mary Parish, Pat Langfitt and 
Novella Price.

Lodge was closed with a 
prayer bv Pat Langfitt.

WMU of the Trinity Baptist 
Church met Tuesday, May 20 at 
the church for Bible study. Eva 
Ashford led the opening prayer.

Bible reading for the day was 
Romans 8: 1-11. The group was

Michael Deaver’s activi­
ties being checked.

Muleshoe Rebekah Lodge No. 
114 met Tuesday night at the 
Lodge Hall for their regular 
meeting Noble Grand Mary 
Franklin called the lodge to 
order with the American Flag 
being presented by Audrey 
Langfitt. The opening prayer 
was given by Terie Snell.

Roll call and the minutes of 
the previous meeting were read 
by Fern Davis. “ Members are 
reminded to bring their stamp 
books in order to give the two 
graduating seniors from the 
Odd Fellow Childrens Home 
gifts for graduation.” said Mrs. 
Franklin.

Nominations for Noble Grand 
for the next term were received 
with Renee’ Rudd being nomi­
nated. Terie Snell and Vi 
Mitchell were nominated for 
Vice Grand for the next term.

A committee to revise and 
update the by-laws was named 
and they are Joylene Costetr, 
Lena Hawkins and Novella 
Price.

Craft projects were discussed. 
These crafts are to be made for

A Thinker
Where there is ar 

open mind there will 
always be a frontier

dailey County Journal USPS 
040 200

Established March 31. 1963. Published by Muleshoe 
Publishing Co., Inc. Every Sunday at 304 W. Second. Box 
449. Muleshoe. Texas. 79347. Second Class Postage paid 
at Muleshoe. Texas 79347.

■

T
L.B Hall-President & Publisher 
Sammyc Hall-Vice President & 

Controller
Clcta Williams-News 
Evelctte Harris-Socicy 

Holly Millsap-Adverfising 
Lillie Nino-Bookkeeping

SUBSCRIPTIONS
Muleshoe Journal and Bailey County Journal 

Bailey and surrounding counties $13.45* 
Muleshoe Journal and Bailey County Journal 

Elsewhere in Texas $13.45
Muleshoe Journal and Bailey County Journal 

Outside of Texas $14.75
Yearly by CArricr $12.50

Advertising rate card o» application.

PIZZA, SALAD & 
SOFT nMNK.*2”
®  I t’s a delectable lunch for 
less! Come to your home town 
Pizza Hut* restaurant and or­
der a Personal Pan Pizza with 
a single topping. Thke one trip 

alad bar.t ‘to the salad 1 Have a me-

272-4214
1422 W. Amer. Blvd. 
Muleshoe

dium soft drink. And pay only 
$2.99! Or go for a Supreme Per­
sonal Pan Pizza and your meal 
deal is only $3.49. !$  Come back 
several times.

p ig & ii K T

Offer good betw een 11 a  m  and 
4 p m. a t  partic ip a tin g  P iu a  Hut* 
res tau ran t*  N ot valid  in com bina­
tion  w ith  any  o th e r offer 
C  1984 P izza H u t. Inc

Julie Sanders 
Honored With 
Senior Luncheon

Nursing Home 
News

B y: Joy Stancell
A senior luncheon was held 

in honor of Julie Sanders at the 
Sanders home recently. Host­
esses for the event were 
Corinne Glenn and M artha 
Sanders, grandmothers of the 
honoree.

Guests present included: 
Courtney Brown, Sherri Stovall, 
Laurie Grant, Christie Landers, 
Susan Lunsford and Deborah 
Nieman.

Decorations were done in blue 
and yellow.

Visits should be short, 
like a Winter’s day.

-Benjamin Franklin.

Happy Birthday this month to 
Lowry Lewis. He was born May 
25. 1900. The Needmore Com­
munity Club will host our 
monthly birthday party Thurs­
day May 22nd at 3:00 p.m.

***
The residents received a 

phone call Tuesday from Janie 
Moraw. She sent them her love. 
We thank her for that.

***
Lewis Scoggins treated all the 

residents to. ice cream one 
evening last week.

WMU Weekly 
Meeting

\\
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Muleshoe Hospital, Nursing Home 
Auxiliary Annual Dinner Held

'• yei 
Me

The annual dinner for the 
• Muleshoe Hospital and Nursing 

Home Auxiliary was held Mon­
day, May 19. at K-Bob’s. 

'  Invocation was led by Rue 
Kimbrough by giving the Aux- 

u iliary Prayer. After the meal. 
Clara Lou Jones, president. 

. recognized Mabel Caldwell, the 
. only charter member and also 

Life Member. Faye Poynor, 
:• Skeet Bradshaw and Paula 

McMeans were recognized for 
their service to the auxiliary and 
because they have moved away. 

T; each was presented with a 
bracelet inscribed with their 
years in auxiliary. Mrs. Mc- 
leans was unable to attend. 

Mrs. Jones also recognized the 
new members of the auxiliary. 
They are Donna Noriega. 
Thresia Davis and Jackie 

‘ Johnson.
The highlight of the evening 

was the presentation of the pins 
and bars presented by Laverne 
James. Each pin or bar re-

? resen ts  500 service hours.
hose receiving pins were: 

Betty Johnson, Donna Noriega 
and Rita Sauer. Those receiving 
bars were: Marie Bradley, Ruth 
C lem ents. Sammie E thridge, 
Dorothy Green, Laverne James, 
Clara Lou Jones and Beth 
Watson.
I There were 1,900 hours work­
ed at the Thrift Shops, 2,664‘/j

Mrs Thomas 
Family Visits
On Mother’s Day

Mrs. Roy Thomas had all of 
her children home for Mother’s 
Day atid a week long visit.

Her children include: Mr. and 
Mrs. Roger Thomas of Temple. 
Clarence Thomas of Lubbock, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Wilson of 
Ventura. Calif.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Roy Thomas of Winston, 
Oregon; Mr. and Mrs. E.J. 
Thomas of Puyallup, Wash.; 
jane McDaniel of West Mini­
ster. Calif.; Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Thomas of Kent. Wash.; and 
Thresia Freeman of Seattle, 
Wash.
 ̂ Friends who visited during 

the day included: Mr. and Mrs. 
A.B. Hawkins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Moore, and Mrs. Esther 
Hawkins, all of Amarillo.

Muleshoe friends visiting 
were: Mr. and Mrs. Travia 
Lambert, Callie Dyke, Ozelle 
Cherry, Lois West, Grace 
Sneed. John Sidd, Christine 
Neeley and Jamie Torres.

It was reported that this was 
the first time Mrs. Thomas had 
all of her children home at one 
time since 1980.

Also visiting during the day 
were: Clarence “ Bud’°  Byers of 
Concord. Calif., Dusty Thomas, 
Shane and Hilda of Lubbock, Jo 
Ann DeHavillan of Blana Vista, 
Colo., Roxann DeHavillan of 
South Padre Island, Tx, and 
Vickie and Jasper Divina of 
Muleshoe.

at the office and 1,094 spent in 
the nursing home making a total 
of 5,658Vj hours the auxiliary 
has given in volunteer service.

“ A special thanks to the 
committee of Laverne James. 
Marie Bradley, and Berta 
Muyshondt for planning the 
dinner and a special thanks to 
Berta Muyshondt for the lovely 
floral table decorations. Also a 
special thanks to Paula Mc­
Means for the preparation of 
the scrap book. This is a history 
of the year’s activities for the 
vear,” said Mrs. Jones.

Officers for the new year are1 
President. Clara Lou Jones- 
First Vice President. Berta 
Muyshondt; Second Vice Presi­
dent, Juaree Smallwood; Trea­
surer. Wilma Davis; Recording 
Secretary, Betty Ramage; Cor­
responding Secretary, Dorothy 
Green; and Historian, Juaree 
Smallwood.

Mrs Wilkinson
Honored
On 85th Birthday

M rs. Joe Wilkinson was 
honored Saturday by some of 
her children and grandchildren 
in observance of her 85th 
b irthday and M other’s Day 
combined.

Those honoring her by being 
with her and cooking a special 
meal for were Wayne and Faye 
Wilkinson of Lubbock, Floyd 
Wilkinson of Odessa; Genevieve 
and Leonard Kerr of Mis­
sissippi, Mable Wages of Earth; 
Ruby and George Smith of 
Auburn, Washington; Raymond 
and Marita Wilkinson and Dena 
of Muleshoe.

She reported that she re­
ceived 100 birthday and Mo­
ther’s Day cards from other 
relatives including the other 
children that could not be 
present and grandchildren, 
great g randchildren , sisters, 
brothers, nieces, nephews and 
friends.

*

/

AUXILIARY ANNUAL DINNER -M em ben  of the Muleshoe 
Hospital and Nursing Home Auxiliary held their annual dinner 
Monday night at K-Bob’s. Faye Poynor, Skeet Bradshaw and 
Paula McMeans were recognized for their service to the auxiliary 
and because they have moved away, each was presented a bracelet 
inscribed with their years in the auxiliary.

Area Retired Teachers Has Luncheon
The 16th and Ave. D. Church ‘ 

of Christ was the location of The 
Muleshe Area Retired Teachers 
Installation of Officers luncheon.
The meeting was held Friday,
May 16, at noon.

After the covered dish meal, 
the President, Maxine Rags­
dale, introduced Glen Williams.
He gave an address on how the 
Silver Haired Legislature could 
aid the needs of the elderly in 
the State of Texas. The two 
Candidates seeking office from 
ths district are: Nathan Tubbs 
of Levelland, and W.A. Leigon 
of Brownfield. If anyone would 
like to cast a vote for either of 
these men, you may do so by 
going by Glen Williams’ office 
at the Muleshoe Courthouse.

Robin Taylor installed the 
following officers: T reasurer 
Lois Witherspoon, Secretary- 
Mary B. Obenhaus, Vice-Presi-

dent-Margie Moore, President- 
Maxine Ragsdale.

Members present were: Lena
Hawkins, Dorothy Beddginfield. 
Mary B. Obenhaus, Margie 
Moore, Mary Louise Thaxton, 
Robin Taylor, Lois Witherspoon, 
Jewel Pool, and Maxine Rags­
dale. Guests were: Glen Wil­
liams and Bettye Hart.

The Next Meeting will be th^ 
beginning of the new yeat 
Friday Sept. 19, 1986.

GMA Coronation

GOLDEN ANNIVERSARY CELEBRATED—Mr. and Mrs. J.G. 
Arnn will observe their 50th wedding aniversary today. Sunday, 
with a family dinner. Hosts will be their children and 
grandhchildren, Mrs. Gail Etheredge of Lubbock, and Mrs. Betty 
Kirby of Maple. The couple celebrated their anniversary with a 
trip to Hawaii. The former Verda Nell Wakefield and Arnn were 
married May 30. 1936, in Sayre, Okla. They have five 
grandchildren and three great grandchildren.
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Set Today \
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CYNTHIA K A Y CHANDLER

Cynthia Chandler 
Receives Degree 
From Texas Tech

Cynthia Kay C handler, a 
1974, graduate of Muleshoe 
High School, received her doc­
toral degree in Counseling 
Psychology from Texas Tech 
University on Saturday, May 17.

Her dissertation was entitled 
“ Validation of the Adlerian 
Construct of Perceived Early 
Childhood Family Influences.’’

She is currently serving’ her 
doctoral internship in Psycho­
logy at Kansas State University 
in Manhattan, Kansas.

Ms. Chandler is the daughter 
of Orbie and Billie Chandler of 

’Lubbock, formerly of Muleshoe, 
and the granddaughter of Mrs. 
Lutishia Watson of Muleshoe.

Richland Hills Baptist Church 
will be the setting for a GMA 
Coronation today, Sunday, May 
25 beginning at 6:30 p.m.

Girls M issionary Auxiliary 
(GMA) is an organization de­
signed to teach young girls 
about m issionaries, scrip ture  
and benevolence. There are five 
Forward Steps involved in 
GMA’s Maiden, Lady-in-Wait- 
ing, Princess, Queen, and > 
Queen with Sceptor.

The following girls will re- IH 
eeive their Maiden pins during 
this coronation: Brenda Mud- 
ford, Erin Kelley, Martha Ann 
Sanders, Christie Maxwell and 
Misty Davenport.

Give That Grad

Balloon
Bouquet

Balloon
Creations

272-4152 
109 E. Ave.B

GIFTS
J /u u tfz £ u e

19.88
Single-Burner Hot Plate fea­
tu re s  tip -re s is ta n t b u rn e r, fu ll- 
range heat control. HP120
2 Bu rner Hot Plate. hp2oo 29.8A

^ R A P

15"
32 qt cooler for
CSns. ice

15.99 NoreiccS
Tkavei Care Compact Iron
with spray and temperature set­
tings tor all fabrics. Folding handle, 
so you can take it anywhere! Ties

89.99
Portable IWin Cassette Re­
corder With AM/FM Stereo
has auto-stop and great-sounding 
tw o-w ay speakers. eesecRs

1250W Hair Dryer offers 2 fan 
speeds, 4 heat settings. W ell-bal­
anced, lightweight design makes it 
easy to use W /concentrator sn?os

27.88
Desk Top Calculator offers 
10-d igit readout and printer. For 
accounting, math work e u w is
Adapter. e« 3e 3.49

Fry & Cox, Inc.
272-4511

Some Merchandise Reduced More 
Boot Flare Straight Leg Cowboy Cut

Wrangler Jeans ®1698
Levi 501 Shrink To Fit ®2198

Boots Drastically Reduced
All Sales 

Final

No Lay A ways 
No Gift 
Wrap

L E E  & E L L A  D U N B A R

WESTERN WEAR I n f *
1910 W. American Blvd *  1 U C ' 

Phone 272-4663



GA Girls Receive Badges
G.A. girls from (he First 

Baptist Church received their 
“ Mission Adventure Badges” 
during morning worship ser­
vices on Sunday, May 18. Work 
for Mission Adventure Badges 

.consist of reading  mission 
stories, memorizing certain 
scripture verses, doing mission 
action for others and regular 
attendance to their G.A. group.

Leaders of the younger G.A. 
group (grades 1-3) are Wilma

Eggers, Sue Haire, and Bobbi 
McCray. Receiving Badge 1 
were Megan and Stacy Harland, 
daughters of Sam and Jean 
Harlan; Aimee Hugg, daughter 
of Gary and Rhonda Hugg and 
Kristen Nichols, daughter of 
Jerry and Susan Nichols. Also 
recognized was Samanatha 
Loftin. daughter of B.J. and 
Sabrina Loftin, who will receive 
her Badge at a later date.

Receiving Badges 1 and 2

OLDER G.A. ’S—Front row (from left) Summer Wiley, Cari Turner, Stacie Harris, April Hugg and 
Shawna Delaney; middle row: Matalie Stout. Stacey Langfitt, April Franklin, and Courtney Tankslcy. 
back row: Leaders, JoAnn Herrington and Karen Harris.

were Layla Harrell, daughter of 
Danny and Joanna Harrell, and 
Carla Jobert (not p resen t), 
daughter of Carl and Janna 
Jobert.

Receiving Badge 3 were Fara 
Black, daughter of Steve and 
Vickie Black; Angela Crawford, 
daughter of Jim  and Jan 
Crawford; Genny Eggers, dau­
ghter of Eddie and Wilma 
Eggers; Barbie Stout, daughter 
of Paul and Elaine Stout; Kristi 
Turner, daughter of Bobby and 
Barbara Turner; Rebecca War­
ren, daughter of Richard and 
Rickie Warren.

Leaders of the older G.A. 
group (grades 4-6) are Karen 
Harris and JoAnn Herrington. 
Receiving Badge 4 were Shawna 
Delaney, daugh ter of Carol 
Delaney; April Franklin, daugh­
ter of Bill and Mary Franklin 
and Courtney Tanksley, daugh­
ter of Spencer and Linda 
Tanksley.

Receiving Badgps 2 and 5 was 
April Hugg, daughter of Gary 
and Rhoijda Hugg.

Receiving Badge 5 were 
Stacie Harris, daughter of Rex 
and Karen Harris; Stacey Lang­
fitt, daughter of Herb and Pat 
Langfitt; Natalie Stout, daughter 
of Paul and Elaine Stout; Cari 
Turner, daughter of Bobby and 
Barbara Turner; Summer Wiley, 
daughter of Kent and Wanda 
Wiley.

5775.00 S139.00

202 Jioin

©the/i Qfjjts cfai udic Qiod c3km 4̂.00

272-3355

Double Coupons
Pay NSave Will Double The Value Of 

Manufacturers Coupons On Saturdays Beginning

May 31,1986
Rules:

1. Double Coupons On Saturday Only

2. One Coupon Per Item Purchased

3. Will Double Coupons Up To 50c Only

4. No Free Coupons Doubled

5. No Cigarettes Or Any Type Of Tobacco 

Coupon Doubled.

6. Coupons Accepted Only For Size And 

Specified Merchandise And Good Date

7. No Coupons Doubled That Excede

Amount Of Item Purchased.
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YOUNGER G.A. '5—Front row (L-R) Megan Harlan and Stacy Harlan; second row: Kristen Nichols, 
Samantha Loftin, Aimee Hugg, and Fara Black; third row: Genney Eggers. Barbie Stout. Angela 
Crawford, Kristin Turner, Layla Harrell and Rebecca Warren; back row: leaders, Wilma Eggers and 
Bobbi McCray.

hMtW ■■ * ■■ w

LATEST 

ARRIVALS

Richard Gonzales

The young man weighed 
seven pounds and one ounce 
and has been named Richard. 
He has a brother, Robert Jr. 
five years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
M rs. Thomas Villalobos of 
Friona and Mr. and Mrs. Jessie 
Gonzales. Sr. of Clovis, N.M.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Gonzales of Friona are the 
proud parents of a son born at 
5:21 a.m. Tuesday, May 20 in 
West Plains Medical Center.

Adrian Photography Is 
Now Offering Photo 

Finishing.
Come To Adrian’s For A ll Your 

Processing Needs.

Present Coupon And 
Receive 10% Off 

All Photo Finishing
Through June 30,1986

(A d /t ia n  cp ko to g ita p ky
218 W. 2nd. 272-3487

MEMORIAL DAT
ANNEX Sale

(old Western Auto Building)

O pen9-5

Savings 20 % o ff
to

50% o ff
ANNEX Sale Will Run 

Mon. May 26 - Sat. May 31
Quality is part of tha bargain. __

Sun. 1*«> p.ni. Mon.-Sat. 8 a.m. - 6 p.m. . ‘121 Main



Page b, Bailey County Journal. Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, May 25, 198b

Honor Students
Cont. from Page 1

Future Teacher Award, Mike 
Holt; Scholar’s Awards, Adena 
Lindt and Mike Holt; Language 
Arts Awards to Jessie Holmes, 
vocabulary; Wade King. English 
IV honors; English IV, Leslie 
Langfitt and Research/Technical 
Writing, Scott C'alvert;

Scott Williams. Creative Wri­
ting; English III (honors) Lisa 
Hamilton; English III, Melissa 
Martel; English II, Sue Haire; 
English I, Andrew Espinoza and 
Correlated Language Arts, Greg 
Moton.

Social studies awards went to; 
Loy Triana, Government/Econo­
mics; Jennifer Green, World 
Geography; Lisa Noble, World 
History (honors); Andrew 
Espinoza, World History; 
Deborah Lackey, American His­
tory (honors); Norma Jean Del 
Toro, American History; and 
Adena Lindt, Leadership.

For the Science awards; Ben 
Allison, Physiology/Anatomy; 
Melissa Martel, Chemistry; 
Jennifer Green, Biology (hon­
ors); Michael Garza. Biology; 
Lisa Noble, Physical Science 
(Honors) and Rachelle Bonham. 
Physical Science.

Business Education Awards 
went to Carvn Durben, Typing; 
Leslie Langfitt, Shorthand; 
Caice Hendrix, Office Proce­
dures; and Norma Castorena. 
Accounting.

Mathematic Awards were gi­
ven Jeff Hicks. Algebra 1; 
Armado Del Toro, Algebra II; 
Melissa Martel, Geometry; 
Jarrod Embry. Advanced Com­
puter; and Casey King, Com­
puter.

Receiving the Fine Arts 
Awards were: Sean Shipman. 
UIL Speech; Sherri Stovall. 
Public Speaking; Leslie Langfitt, 
Debate; Darren A lbertson, 
Drama; Michael Angeley, Tech­
nical Theatre; Jaime Torres. 
Art; Sergio Leal, Band and

Williams...
Cont. from Page 1
matters of interest to them, 
explained Williams.

Williams said it is new, and is 
consequently not well under­
stood at this time. ‘‘But it is 
important.” he stressed, “ and 
in years to come will prove to 
be a powerful force for good for 
all our elderly people.”

For further information con­
tact Robin Taylor at 272-319b or 
Glen Williams at 272-3b47.

Stephen Ethridge, Band Theory.
Jodi Ferris, Spanish II; 

Andrew Espinoza, Spanish I and 
Jeff Hicks, French I. took the 
Foreign Language Awards.

In Vocational Cooperative A- 
wards. Jayna Harris was pre­
sented the Home Economics 
Cooperative Association award; 
Kenneth Maxwell. Marketing 
and Distributive Education a- 
ward and Jeff Vinson, ag 
award.

Vocational Awards were pre­
sented as follows: Mike Holt, 
Vocational Agriculture IV; Brent 
Black, Vocational Agriculture. 
Ill; Barry Bass, Vocational 
Agriculture 11; Carol Copley, 
Vocational Agriculture I; Twila 
Downing. Child Development: 
Jayna Harris, Home Manage­
ment: Norman Perez. Home 
Economics II; Diane Enos. 
Home Econmics I; Courtney 
Brown. Foods/Nutrition; Paul 
Chamberlin. Home Furnishings; 
Becky Acosta. Home and Family 
Living; Adena Lindt, Consumer 
Education; and Jose Sanchez. 
Auto Mechanics.

Leslie Langfitt won the Li­
brary Award; and Sherri Stovall 
won the Yearbook Award, while 
Susan Lunsford was presented 
the newspaper award.

Carol Copley was named* 
winner of the Girls’ Physical 
Education Award and Adolfo 
Macias was given the Boy’s 
Physical Education Award, and 
Brent Black won the Health 
Award.

Winners of the Athletic A- 
wards were Adena Lindt and 
Caice Hendrix.

Awards...
Cont. from Page 1

Lira. Juan Pacheco. Juan Perez, 
JoAnn Reyna, Burnley Riley 
and Eddie Vasquez.

EIGHTH GRADE 
Ronnie Gail Barrett, Jenny 

Bennett. Sharia Evins, Adclaido 
Godinez, Holly Huckaby. Anna 
Jaramillo, Marcy Jaramillo, Ra­
mon Sanchez, Carissa Sander­
son and Tricia Underwood.

Also recognized were the 
1985-86 Student Council offi­
cers, including, Lisa Triana, 
president; Hector Flores, vice 
president; Amber Green, parl­
iamentarian; Amy Harrison, re­
porter; Doug Chitwood, histor­
ian and Stacy McElroy, secret­
ary.

Ben Frankiin>
\ B etter  qualify fo r  less  8aJ
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Washington...
ConL from Page 1

He grinned when asked about 
his- future plans, and says he 
plans to stay in Muleshoe. “ But 
1 may do a little fishing, and 
‘try’ to do a little relaxing,” he 
said, “ but I also plan to do 
some community work that 
needs to be done, and will 
continue my tree trimming, 
along with a little carpenter 
work, just to stay busy. I’m 
really looking forward to retire­
ment.”

During the past year, he has 
helped his son, Mark, remodel 
the former Bell farm house after 
it was moved into Muleshoe. 
Located at Avenue C. it is the- 
only two-story home on that 
block. Washington said it was a 
lot of work, but was well worth 
it.

Mark has stayed in Muleshoe, 
and is married to the former 
Linda Bell. He has been an 
employee of Five Area Tele­
phone Cooperative for the past 
five years.

The Washington’s other child, 
daughter Lana (M rs. Mike) 
Lewis, resides in Lubbock where 
her husband is associated with 
Waddington Advertising Agen­
cy-

Muleshoe...
Cont. from Page I

AAU Basketball will be spon­
soring a basketball tournament 
at Farwcll and Texico gyms this 
weekend. Thursday through 
Saturday. The tournament will 
be to help raise money for the 
state AAU tournament in Clovis 
June 5-7. Muleshoe girls parti­
cipate in AAU Basketball said 
Deborah Noble.

Also, the winner of the AAU 
Basketball meal giveaway was 
Rickie B. Seaton of Lazbuddie, 
said Mrs. Noble.

***
On Saturday, June 7, the 

Littlefield Chamber of Com­
merce will be sponsoring a 10-K 
run in conjunction with the 
Denim Arts Festival to be held 
in Littlefield on that day.

Registration will get under­
way at 9 a.m. at the race site 
(Littlefield Crescent Park). All 
runners will be receiving a free 
T-shirt with their $10 entry fee.

For additional inform ation, 
contact the race chairm an. 
Julian Saenz at 806/385-4481 or 
385-4589, or write 10-K Run, 
P-O. Box 72, Littlefield. TX 
79339.

Best...
Cont. from Page 1

At Three Way, leading the 
1986 graduating class as vale­
dictorian will be Brett Stegall, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Stegall.

He has a grade point average 
of 94.27 and has been active in 
sports and other activities at the 
school during his years there.

Salutatorian is Marcus Huff 
with a four year grade point 
average of 93.84.

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer ‘Bud’ Huff, and has 
been active in sports and FFA 
during his school years.

Graduation...
Cont. from Page 1
celebration at Texas Tech Uni­
versity Recreation Center in 
1984. and repeated with a 
sim ilar celebration in 1985. 
Coronado and Shallowater High 
Schools each had a celebration 
at Tech Recreation Center in 
1985 also.

Activities for Project Gradua­
tion vary from school to school. 
Some of the activities include 
swimming parties, barbecues, 
dinners and dances, picnics, 
casino parties, dude ranches, 
beach parties, and bowling. 
Activities may be held in any 
facility large enough to accom­
modate the number of students 
involved. School buildings, rac- 
quetball establishments, health 
spas, and college recreation 
centers are popular places for 
graduation events.

C elebrations are generally 
held on the night after gradua­
tion and wind up with a 
breakfast the next morning and 
cleanup. However, the concept 
of drug-free, alcohol-free cele­
brations, or dry celebrations 
may be used for the high school 
prom or at any time. In a 
Project Graduation celebration 
students sign a pledge that they 
will come to the event sober are 
not allowed to bring alcohol or 
drugs, and if they leave the 
party, they arc not allowed to 
return. Some people call an 
event such as this a lock-in.

Any interested students, par­
ents or teachers who would like 
to have a kit showing how to 
conduct a Project Graduation 
party should contact Ruby M. 
Jackson, Traffic Safety Specia­
list at the State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans­
portation District Office in 
Lubbock at 745-4411.

The George Washingtons are 
also grandpa and grandma to 
one little grandson.

Mrs. Washington (Lois) will 
be keeping her job as secretary 
at Muleshoe High School.

“I’ve had some pleasant 
years,” said Washington, “ and 
will miss the schools. But. for 
the past 36 years, counting my 

-time in the military, I have had 
a lot of service. I don’t want to 
be tied down steady anymore.”
Conducting a lineup 
at the scene of the crime 
may help w itness’s recall

COLLEGE STATION — Witnesses 
who have trouble recognizing a criminal 
suspect in a lineup may have better luck 
if the lineup is conducted at the scene of 
the crime, says a lexas A&M University 
psychologist.

Dr. Steven Smith, an assistant proles­
sor of psychology w hose special research 
area is memory enhancement, con­
ducted experiments showing that eye­
witness recognition and overall recall of 
ail event tends to he more accurate at 
the place where it happened.

President Reagan endorses 
tighter reins on military spending.

BIBLE I
VERSE r c

/ r i
This is the confidence that we 

have in him: that, i f  we ask 
anything according to his will, he 
heareth us.

1. Of whom is the w riter

speaking?
2. Who made the above state- o 
ment?
3. By what term was he known?
4. Where may this statement be 
found?
Answ ers to Bible Vetee
1. Of Jesus Christ.
2. John the Apostle.
3. The “ Disciple whom Jesus 
loved.”
4. I John 5:14. 9

Poynors Has Bought White’s Remaining Stock 
Of Air Conditioners And Are Passing The Savings On

To You.
-••• •
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198Save *31.99
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Gtem pton RR0O-CFM evaporsthrs confer. Here’s energy-saving com - 
tort that makes sense! Features two speeds, handv up-front controls 
and adjustable air flow. 3-way water distribution system for best cool- 
*ng efficiency Includes window mount kit. 175-0195
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Save
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Champion 4000-CFM 
Evaporative Cooler
Cool off Without the high cost of refrigerated 
a.r unit comes complete with dependable 
jfspeed hp motor, large squirrel race 
blower, recirculating pump and ad us tab!« 
louvers. Installation kit included X *  ?

Muleshoe 272-4552
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Hartzog Services Angels Of Mercy
Held Saturday WestPlain*
In Bovina M ed ia l Center

A few old-time remedies have 
proved effective such as eating 
green apples for the treatment 
of diarrhea (modern therapy 
now includes apple pectin) and 
using the extract from the fox 
glove plant to trea t heart
problems (this extract is still 
used today and is called
Digitalis). In years passed, the 
public was forced to utilize
superstitious and old-time cures 
because of a variety of reasons: 
The scarity of physicians, or 
because of the limitations of 
science in past years to find a 
“ cure” for their ailment. We
are fortunate that this is not the 
case today. Modern medicine, 
new and improved medications, 
and a more exact scientific 
approach in solving medical 
mysteries has given us the 
ability to help more ill people 
than ever before become well. 
Your best course of action when 
you are ill is to see your doctor. 
He is the expert!

T. Wilson RN DON WPMC

Joy Wallace 
Services Held 
Here Saturday

Services for Joy Wallace. 60, 
of Friona were held at 2 p.m. 
Saturday in Ellis Funeral Home 
Chapel of Chimes in Muleshoe 
with the Rev. Pat Riley, 
minister of the First Baptist 
Church of Farwell, officiating.

Burial was in the Sudan 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Ellis and Blackwell Funeral 
Home of Friona. Ms. Wallace 
died at 9:45 p.m. Wednesday in

Sudan News
by

Evelyn Ritchiem onths. She had lived in 
Jackson, Miss., for 17 years.
She was a bookkeeper for 
Franklin Printers and was a 
Baptist.

Survivors include two son,
Billy Huggins of Los Angeles.
Calif., Ronald J. Wallace of 
Jackson, Miss.; a daughter,
Debbie Scott of Washington,
D.C.; two stepson, Tom 
Wallace, Jr., and Bill Wallace 
of Fort Bliss; two sisters,
Elouise Robertson of Farweli 
and Gladyne Blind of Yuma,
A riz.; two b ro thers , Tom 
Beauchamp of Bovina and B.A.
Beauchamp of Sudan; and seven 
grandchildren.
Texas A&M engineer 
has developed method 
for making robots ‘see’

COLLEGE STATION — An electri 
cal engineering researcher at Texas Masonic Lodge 
A&M University has developed a new 
method to make robots’ camera “eyes’
see much like humans do — ' B_ , .
perception. Club and the Bovina Lions Club.

“It is very exciting because robot si- He served on the Federal 
sion is important for space docking, Land Bank Board in Muleshoe 
autonomous vehicles (vehicles that for more than 15 years. He was 
drive themselves with artificial intelli- a member of the Plains Cotton 
gence) and for robots on underwater Growers Association. He taught 
vehicles,” said Dr. Norman Griswold, vocational agriculture for six 
the developer and an associate profes- years in Meadow. He was 
sor of electrical engineering. county agent for Terry and

With a grant from NAS As Johnson Floyd Counties and was assis- 
Space Center, Griswold has developed a tant county agent for Lubbock 
new stereo vision model based on the County in the 1940’s. He was a 
mechanisms of human vision. Using Methodist.
mathematics, Criswold’s system fuses Survivors include his wife, 
the images from two parallel cameras Bernice; a son, Arlin “ Roy’’ of 
into one image — an image that looks Bovina; three daughters, Helen 
much like what is seen by the human Estlack of C larendon, Kay
eye. The process is performed by a Strawn of Panhandle and Dixi 
computer in about 10 seconds. O’Brien of Pueblo. Colo.; four

“Once a robot has depth perception, sisters, Winnie Mae Condron of 
it can reach out and grab something or Elgin, Opal Sikes of Clovis,
know how far it has to travel to get N.M., Mary Beth Redden of
something,” the lexas A&M engineer Clovis, N.M. and Frances Hod- 
said. ges of Tulia; five brothers, Billie

Griswold studied medical and biolog- Sudderth of Bovina, Melvin 
ieal journals to learn how it is believed Sudderth of Shawnee-, OKla., 
humans see and to find out how to and Don Sudderth of Alamogor- 
simulate brain function. His computer do, N.M.; seven grandchildren; 
model is based on theories of how the and a great grandchild, 
brain’s visual cortex fuses the two im­
ages from human eyes by directional

Jonelle Bandy hosted a salad 
.supper Tuesday night for ladies 
of the Sudan Church of Christ 
when some 28 ladies attended. 
The Young Ladies Bible Class 
presented the program “ Wom­
en of the Bible” and also 
p resen ted  their teacher, Jo 
Boyless, an appreciation gift.

Mrs. Estelle Lowe visited in 
L ittlefield Sunday with her 
cousin, Francis Johnson of 
Henrietta who was on the Texas
Sesquicentennial Wagon Train. 

***
Recently visiting with Mr. 

and M rs. Craig Doty and 
Kim berly were her m other, 
Joyce Thompson and brother 
Andy and sister, Terri Brown all 
of Aspermont and grandmother, 
Mrs. Inez Hursts of Aspermont.

They were here to attend 
graduation exercises at South 
Plains College when Mrs. Doty 
was among those graduating. 
They also brought home the 
Doty’s daughter, Kimberly, who 
has been there visiting for 
several days.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Reagan May of 

Chapel Hill, N.C. are visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
May and other family members.

Funeral services for Arlin L. 
Hartzog, 72, of Farwell were 
held at 2:30 p.m. Saturday in 
the F irst United M ethodist 
Church in Bovina with the Rev. 
J.B. Fowler, a retired Methodist 
minister from Amarillo, officiat­
ing.

Masonic graveside services 
were conducted in the Bovina 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Ellis-Blackwell Funeral Home. 
Hartzog died Wednesday at his 
home following a lengthy ill­
ness. Justice of the Peace 
Albert Smith ruled the death 
due to natural causes.

Born in Pleasant Hill, N.M., 
he has lived in Parmer County 
most of his life. He married 
Bernice Clark on July 31. 1936. 
in Amarillo. He was a farmer 
and a member of Meadow 

in Ropesville 
and was a 32nd degree Mason. 
He was a former member of the 

with depth Jaycees, the Floydada Rotary

FOLK MEDICINE AND 
OLD-TIME “ CURES”

In ancient and prim itive 
cu ltu res, magic, incantation, 
and conjuration were used to 
heal diseases and “ cast out” 
death, thought to be caused by 
malignant spirits. The concept 
of incantation, recited or worn 
as an amulet, was regarded as 
effective well into the European 
Middle' Ages. There were ex­
ceptions. The ancient “ Egyptian 
Book of Surgery” , dating from 
2500 BC makes only a single 
reference to a method of magic 
in its discussions of 48 separate 

’surgical operations.
One of the most influential 

concepts of medical practice was 
the doctrine of s ignatu res, 
originating in either Egypt or 
Babylonia and holding sway 
until the 17th century. The 
doctrine held that all natural 
objects (plants, herbs, animals, 
animal parts) were marked by a 
sign that revealed their medi­
cinal benefit for specific ail­
ments. Basically these plants or 
animal parts were used because 
of some resemblance to the 
disease to be cured or to the 
diseasd part of the body. Thus, 
the poppy was used for brain 
disorders because its fruit was 
shaped like a head; red roses 
were considered beneficial for 
blood problems, gummy plants 
for pusexuding sores, many- 
seeded plants for barrenness, 
trefoiled plants for heart trouble 
and so on.

Some superstitious remem- 
dies used for illness included: A 
poultice of cow manure for 
aches and pains, a poultice of 
blackpepper and lard for asth­
ma, an amulet of camphor 
around the neck was supposed 
to be effective in warding off 
contagious diseases, and for a 
sore throat the patient was 
encouraged to wear gold or 
amber bead necklaces (good for 
the jewelery industry but was 
not very effective medicine for 
the patient!).

Owen Egger 
• Services Held 

AtMorton
Funeral services for Owen 

Egger, 62, of Morton were held 
at 11 a.m. Friday in the First 
United Methodist Church of 
Morton with the Rev. Duane 
Knowlton, pastor, and the Rev. 
Floyd Dunn, Methodist minister 
from Abilene, officiating.

In term ent was in Morton 
Memorial Cemetery under the 
direction of Ellis Funeral Home 
of Morton. Egger died Tuesday 
in Cochran County Hospital 
following a brief illness.

Egger was bom in Mena. 
Ark., and had lived in Morton 
since 1956, moving there from 
Ropesville. He married Yvonne 
Cross on Nov. 24, 1943, in 
Moran. He was a farmer and a 
former member of the Co-Op 
Gin board, the Morton In­
dependent School Board and the 
FHA board. He also was a 
veteran of the U.S. Army, 
serving in World War II. He 
was a member of the First 
United Methodist Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
Yvonne; two sons, Ken of 
Morton and Mike of Hyattsville, 
Md.; a daughter, Patricia Jeff- 
coat of M idland; a s is te r, 
Johnnie Bell Simmons of Lor­
enzo; a b ro th er, D arris of 
Sweetwater; and two grand­
children.

The great business of life is to be, 
to do, and to do without, and 
to depart.

-John Morley.

Life is an instinct for growth, for 
survival, for the accumulation 
of forces, for power.

-F.W. Nietzsche.

For The Best Garden

or Flowers, Get Your

Bedding Plants Now!

K risty’s Plants f
703 W. Ave. J. 272-5134

PRESCrfTIMG ELEGANT

STAINLESS
TABLEWARE

SEE STORE DISPLAY FOR COMPLETE DETAILS

PLMEAJ

Tn.s Weeks Feature Item
T e a s p o o n WITH EACH U  00 

PURCHASE
AT PARTICIPATING STORES

NON-DAIRY TOPPING
WILSON'S JUMBO MEAT

SMOKED SAUSAGE

12 OZ. 
BOWL

BAG ICE "THE SUNDAY BACON" 
HORMU'S B U C K  UBEL

9” SOLO PLASTIC

PARTY PLATES PRICE SAVER

ftOIAIO CHIPS

QUARTERED MARGARINE
PAPER TOWELS

16 OZ. PLASTIC 
TRANSLUCENTSHURFINE ASST. FLAVORS

KINGSFORD

REDR0ME

APPLES
TENDER CRUST HAMBURGER/GOLDEN SWEET

4 VS0Z 
PUMP

B S
MEMBER STORE

PRICES EFFECTIVE
MAY 25-28, 1986

KRAFT REG./LIGHT

^TFFIIIATED
FOODS INC to give you m ore

A ® ,

Mt Y00 AW Tout PAMILT

T o d a y ! . . .

M e N r  (M

' j i b a eane. awe • * »ri*ee
a»w>>iwer*-

r ^ r
M rt'* W »
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This is the day America has set aside to honor its fallen war dead, 
those brave men and women who gave their lives on the battlefields 
of our nation’s history. We honor them and show our eternal 
gratitude for their sacrifices by keeping alive their memories in  
continual dedication to the goals o f peace and the preservation of 
liberty.

i

9
8
6

MEMORIAL DAY — that our brave heroes have not died in vain.

Sponsored By The Following Merchants:

\
!

.

I

*

Anthonys Dept. Store 

JLC Company 

Black Insurance 

G l e n n a ’s Beauty Retreat 

Lambert Cleaners 

Lee’s Western Wear, Inc. 

McCormick Seeds Inc. 

Muleshoe Trade Center

Pay -n- Save

Shipman & Son Body Shop 

Spurgeon’s Motor Machine 

Watson Alfalfa Inc.

John’s Custom Mill 

Spudnut Shop 

Serv-All Thriftway 

Terry Field Insurance

Lookin Good Ladies Wear Lindsey Credit Jewelry

K-Bobs ’Resta
\

Bailey County Propane

Main Street Beauty Salon 

Higginbotham -Bartlett

Farmers Co-Op Elevators Muleshoe Floral & Gift

Decorators Nursery & Floral Alton Burton Service Center

Five Area Telephone Cooperative Inc. 

Southwestern Geothermal Systems

Muleshoe Livestock Auction, Inc. Hockheim Prairie Farm Mutual Insurance
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MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Reydon Stanford of Amaril­

lo to Sheri Ann Ellard of 
Muleshoe.

WARRENTY DEEDS 
Lloyd Earl Pollard, Jr., 

joined pro forma by my wife, 
Jenice Pollard to Harold s! 
Pollard. The West one-half of 
Tract 109 League 182, Floyd 
County School Land, Bailey 
County, Texas.

Harold S. Pollard, Jr., joined 
pro forma by my wife, Lillian 
Pollard to Lloyd Earl Pollard, 
Jr. The East one-half of Tract 
110, League 182, Floyd County 
School Land, Bailey County, 
Texas.

Elma M. Pruitt a /k /a  E.M. 
Pruitt and wife, Loren Pruitt to 
Federal Deposit Insurance Cor­
poration. The surface estate 
only of Lot 7, Richland Hills 
Addition to the town of Mule­
shoe, Bailey County, Texas as 
shown by plat recorded in 
Volume 69, Page 5, Deed 
Records of Bailey County, 
Texas.

Michael W. Hahn and wife, 
Terri Crane Hahn to Michael 
Lopez and wife, Rachel Lopez. 
All of Lot No. (9), in Block No. 
one (1), Crawford Addition to 
the City of Muleshoe, Bailey 
County, Texas, as shown by plat 
of said Addition recorded in 
Vol. 49, page 299, Deed records 
of Bailey County, Texas.

COUNTY COURT 
Salvador Villareal, Order of 

Dismissal.
Theresa Fine Ramage, Order 

of Dismissal.
DISTRICT COURT 

Connie Tonie Gamboa 
Martinez and Johnnie Martinez 
and in the interest of Robert 
Jesse Martinez and Melissa 
Marie Martinez, children. De­
cree of Divorce.

NEW VEHICLES

West Plains 
Hospital Report

PATIENTS IN WEST PLAINS
MEDICAL CENTER. INC.

M A Y  20
MULESHOE-J*a* " 'M o rtw , 

John Fried, Oleine Wafts4’ and 
Celestine Lewis. SUNDOWN- 
Elizabeth Morris. FRIONA- 
Maria Gonzales and Baby Boy 
Gonzales.

M A Y  21
MULESHOE-Rosie Toscano, 

Janie Moraw, John Fried, Olene 
W atts and Burrell Black. 
EARTH-Augustina Garcia. FRI- 
ONA-Maria Gonzales and Baby 
Boy Gonzales.

M A Y  22
MULESHOE-Rosie Toscano, 

Matilda Slemmons, Janie Mor­
aw, Lloyd William and Burrell 
Black. EARTH-Augustine Gar­
cia.

Harry A. Grantz, 1986 Pont 
4dr, Robert D. Green. Inc.

Derwin Beauchamp, 1986 
Ford PU, Muleshoe Motor Co. 
Inc.

Van Tac, 1986 GMC Van. 
Robert D. Green, Inc.

Muleshoe 
School Menu

BREAKFAST
MONDAY

Milk. Cereal. Fruit. Toast 
TUESDAY

Milk, Cheese Toast, Fruit 
WEDNESDAY 

Milk. Honey Buns. Juice 
LUNCH 

MONDAY
Milk. Pizza. Mixed Vegetables, 
Pickles. Fruit

TUESDAY
Milk. Hamburgers. Lettuce & 
Tomato, Pickles & Onions. 
Tater Tots, Cookies

WEDNESDAY
Milk, Sandwiches. Pork & 
Beans, Chips, Carrot Stick. 
Fruit

COMBO LINE 
MONDAY

Milk or Tea. Steak & Gravy. 
Creamed Potatoes. Green 
Beans. Hot Rolls, Fruit 

TUESDAY
Milk or Tea. Juicy Burgers. 
Lettuce & Tomato, Pickles & 
Onions, Tater Tots. Cookies 

WEDNESDAY
Milk or Tea, Sandwiches, Pork 
& Beans, Chips. Carrot Stick. 
Fruit
SCHOOLS OUT HAVE A NICE 
SUMMER

Lazbuddie 
School Lunch

BREAKFAST 
MONDAY 

Toast, Juice, Milk
TUESDAY 

Cereal, Juice, Milk
WEDNESDAY 

Toast, Juice, Milk
THURSDAY 

Cereal, Juice, Milk 
FRIDAY

Cinnamon Rolls, Milk 
LUNCH 

MONDAY
Manager’s Choice, Salad, Corn, 
Milk

TUESDAY
H am burgers, Chips, Pickles, 
Lettuce, Pork and Beans, Fruit, 
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
Manager’s Choice, Milk 

THURSDAY
Hamburgers, Tator Tots. Let­
tuce, Pickles, Brownies, Milk 

FRIDAY
Bologna Sandwiches, Potato 
Chips, Pickles, Ice Cream, Milk 

SALADS
Check each day, as they will 
also be Manager’s Choice, and 
some days, there will not be a 
salad offered

Late March car sales worst since 
1982.

Stress On Farm Family: 
Focus Of Conference

Stress and its impact on the 
farm family will be the focus of 
a conference for health profes­
sionals at W ayland Baptist 
University in Plainview on 
Friday, May 30, from 8:30 a.m. 
to 4:00 p.m.

“ It is essential to the mental 
health of the rural community to 
identify the stressors specific to 
rural living and then to develop 
tools for assessment and com­
prehensive strategies for cop­
ing.’’ according to Karen 
Mountain, R.N., M.S.N.. pro­
ject director for the Texas Office 
of Rural Health, sponsor of the 
conference. The Hogg Founda­
tion for M ental Health is 
supplying funding for the con­
ference, one of a series of 
regional conferences on stress 
and rural Texas.

Rick Van Hersh, executive 
director of the Plainview Coun­
seling C enter, is the local 
coordinator. All activities will 
take place in the Nunn Business

Red Cross Programs 
Are Available 
To Youth Groups

The South Plains Regional 
Chapter of the American Red 
Cross is currently seeking youth 
organizations which may wish to 
sponsor Red Cross training as 
part of their summer activities.

Red Cross youth activities are 
available for young people of 
kindergarten  through high 
school age. These programs 
cover a broad range of topics, 
although most are health and 
safety oriented. These include 
an Alcohol Information Module 
and B abysitter Training for 
students in the secondary 
grades and Basic Aid Training 
and “ I Do Declare: 1 Am 
Aware’’ for elementary grades.

Anyone wishing information 
on Red Cross youth programs 
may contact Rynnea Wright, 
regional Red Cross Youth Ser­
vices Coordinator, at 765-8534 
in Lubbock.

For All Your 

Local Nows 

Or Club Activities 

Call 2724536 
Or Come By 

Hie Journal Office

Administration Building on

Firefighter’*  

Report
by Wayne Peterson

The April minutes were read 
by Bill Kinard after President 
H.E. Reeder called the business 
meeting to order, they were 
approved as read.

H.E. Reeder reported on open 
house at the Sudan Fire 
Department’s new facility which 
he and other Muleshoe Firemen 
attended. The Sudan firemen 
demonstrated some of their 
tools and firefighting and evac­
uation skills. Sudan has a very 
good department, trained well 
and proficient. The Sudan and 
Muleshoe Fire Departments 
have had to call on one 
another’s help many times in 
the past and each department 
has great respect for each other. 
Congratulations are in order for 
Sudan and their fine depart­
ment.

The M uleshoe departm ent 
will have golf teams participat­
ing in the m iniature golf 
tournament May 29. Get your­
self a team and join in.

May’s fireman profile is Tom 
Ladd. Tom grew up with fire 
fighting, his father and grand­
father both were firemen. He 
joined the department Septem­
ber 7, 1977. He attended school 
at Muleshoe and college at 
Texas Tech. Tom’s wife’s name 

Gwen who also attendedis
ts pa

owner and parts man at Earl 
Ladd & Sons Inc. 602 W. 
American Blvd. He has attend­
ed many training schools in­
cluding Texas A& M, Lubbock 
and Canyon. The department is 
fortunate to have Tom Ladd as a 
member of the team.

The latest recruit voted into 
the departm ent was Jimmy 
Mills, self employed and runs 
Muleshoe Body Shop on north 
first. Jimmy’s wife’s name is 
Jeane. They have one son, 5 
year old Scotty. Congratulations 
Jimmy.

There were 14 fires called 
during April, about 140 man 
hours used. Six calls were rural, 
eight in tne City. A total of 
514 miles run up on fire units. 
There was one false alarm, one 
barn , two dw ellings, th ree 
grass, two city dumpsters, two 
cotton burres, one dinner, one 
truck turn over at hiway 70 and 
84 intersection and one training 
drill in cooperation with local 
EMT and medical units, law 
enforcement departments and 
utilities company.

PMis ‘t ’Mowe'
~ fX W

Supervised By Texas Department of Ranking 
Price Frozen At I tme Of Purchase

West 7th street.
The morning session of the 

conference will concentrate on 
an overview of stress and its 
consequences by Bill Pierce, 
director of the Caprock Plains 
Center for Counseling. A panel 
discussion on the fa rm ers’ 
perspective will complete the 
morning program.

Afternoon workshops will ad­
dress various specific issues, 
including drug abuse, alcoho­
lism, suicide, depression, family 
violence, child abuse, re-educa­
tion and training for farmers, 
and the future of farming.

According to Lois Barry, 
director of the Texas Office of 
Rural Health, the conference 
will provide health care profes­
sionals with information on 
stress and its impact on the 
mental and physical health of 
the farm family, along with 
skills to assist the family in 
coping with stress.

No Better 
No matter how much you 

nurse a grudge, it won’t gel 
better.

-Journal, Petersburg.

Texas A&M sociologist 
finds Mexican-American 
family roles changing

COLLEGE STATION — Old stereo­
types about Mexican-American families 
are outmoded and invalid, particularly 
for professional and working class 
families who are undergoing profound 
changes, says a Texas A&M University 
sociologist.

Dr. Norma Williams, an assistant 
professor of sociology who has been 
studying Mexican-American families in 
the Austin and Corpus Christi areas, 
says many commonly-held beliefs about 
Mexican-American family relationships 
are wrong.

“To read the literature, men have a lot 
of machismo, they are very patriarchal, 
and the women are weak, passive and 
submissive. 1 think a lot of the material 
is outdated and erroneous,’ she says. “It 
(the stereotype) has been overgeneral­
ized and overromanticized.’

Williams, whose research is funded 
by the National Science Foundation and 
who is preparing to write a book on her 
findings, says the changes taking place 
in Mexican-American family life include 
the lessening importance of the baptis­
mal ceremonies and shrinking of ex­
tended families.

She says as more and more Mexican- 
American women follow careers, they 
are engaging in the creation of new roles 
for themselves and the husbands are 
responding to these important changes.

Don’t gamble

with HAIL
Insure today with , f 
Farmers Union erdp hall insurance) '

m s u R f l n c E  c o m p n n i E S

for complete insurance needs

ROY WHITT
Insurance

201 Main 272-3611

John Deere 
row-crop tractor 
savings countdown
We have a good selection of John Deere 
4050 through 4850 Row-Crop Tractors that 
you can buy at huge savings. The earlier 
you buy, the more you can save. See us for
details.
•  Interest-free financing* until January 1, 

,9 8 ? on new models. (October 1, ,986  
on used models).

• Discount in lieu of finance waiver on

•  v e r y  amaefive factory discounts passed 
on to you.

•Amiability of John 0~~ "***' *> *
cradtt

See us right away-the sooner the better

Dent & Co.
W. Hwy. 84 2724296

Now you see it.. 
Now you don’t

Daybreak.
The Chem ical Dependency Program  
from Clovis H igh Plains H ospital.

You can’t make an alcohol/chemical 
dependency problem disappear like magic.
The effective, practical solution you need 
comes from Daybreak, the new intensive 
outpatient treatment program from Clovis 
High Plains Hospital.
Daybreak brings hope for a normal family 
life to those with an alcohol/chemical 
dependency problem. Our outpatient 
program allows you and your family to 
participate in treatment together while 
continuing to meet responsibilitiesat work 
and at home. With Daybreak, your hope 
for a new beginning becomes a reality.
You and our professional staff work 
together to plan an individual program of 
education and counseling. Daybreak’s 
medical director supervises all treatment 
and works with your family physician 10 
resolve any medical problems. Our 
aftercare plan is designed to help you 
continue on the road to recovery.
Call us for information and a brochure at
763-5554.

DAYBREAK
A n  a ff i l ia te  o f

Clovis High Plains Hospital
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B ailey County
Journal Classified Call 272-4536

O

CLASSIFIED 
RATES 

First Insertion
Per Word..........S.15

Minimum Charge 
$2,30

Consecutive
Insertions

Per Word..........$.13
Minimum Charge

$2.00

CLASSIFIED 
DISPLAY RATES 

$1.75
Per Column Inch

BLIND AD RATES 
50% More

DEADLINES
12 noon Tues. 

For Thursday Paper 
12 Noon Fri.

For Sunday Paper

We reserve the 
right to classify. re­
vise. or reject any 
ad. Not responsible 
for any error after 
ad has run once.

1. Personals a  Real Estate a  Real Estate a  Real Estate a  Real Estate 8. Real Estate a  Real Estate

STORAGE 
Rooms Available 

For Storage 
$25.00 - $30.00 

per month 
Ted Barnhill 

272-4903 
bl-42s-stfc

Kenneth fcvms’
Handyman

Service
Painting Remodeling 
Repairing. And more

Call: 965-2759 
M idcshoe^J^xa^9347.

1. Personals

H O M E  R E P A I R S  
F.M . Saldana Con-' 
struction, licensed and 
b o n d e d  p lu m b e r .  
Specialized in cement, 
carpenter work, re­
modeling. painting, 
acoustical ceilings. 
272-4955. 
sl-16s-tfc
FURNITURE Uphols'N 
ering & repairs. 
Burrows Upholstery 
Shop 209 W. 2nd 
Phone 272-4255 Home 
Phone 272-5722. 
bl -41 t-tfc

PARTY TIME 
Boones Burger U.S.A. 
now booking private 
parties any night buf­
fet. bar-b-que or 
chicken fried steak or 
fish - BYOB. Call 
Boone, Springlake. 
986-4242. 
bl-20s-4tsc.

JERRY'S ROOFING & 
Painting. Roofing & 
painting-all types. 
Call for free estimate. 
Jerry Helton 272- 
3836. 
h i -21 t-tfc
BEAUTIFUL PIANO. 
must transfer to good 
local people. Call 
Joplin Piano, 1-800- 
641-4645, ext. 244. 
jl-21t-2tp

WANTED Interior & 
Exterior painting. Call 
Tommy Hall. 272- 
4874. 
hl-20t-Stp
MA R Y  K A Y  COS­
M E T I C S  J o s ie  
Flowers 272-3865 
l-40s-tfc

3. Help Wanted

NOW TAKING BIDS 
For maintenance 

on SPARTAN TRAN 
SPORTATION VEHI­
CLES (full size cars 
and vans). Including 
major repairs and 
preventive mainten­
ance program . For 
more information con­
tact: SPARTAN
TRANSPORTATION . 
P.O. Box 610, Level- 
land, Tx. 79336. By 
May 26, 1986. 
s3-21t-2tsc

GENERAL 
SHELTERS 

of Texas, Inc.
The fastest growing 
manufacturers of port­
able buildings. is 
seeking a dealer in 
the area for retail 
sales of portable 
build ings. Lot and 
small investment re­
quired. Excellent op­
portunity to expand 
existing business with 
low risk.

Contact Mike Wulf 
General Manager 

817-422-4547 
g3-20t-6tpts
APPLICATIONS now 
being taken the Bailey 
County Sheriffs Office 
will have two open­
ings for Jailer, start­
ing June 1, 1986. For 
information come by 
300 South 1st St. High 
School or GED re­
quired. No criminal 
record. 
s3-20s-3tc
EASY ASSEMBLY 
WORK! $714.00 per 
100. Guaranteed pay­
ment. No sales. De- 
tails-send stamped 
envelope: ELAN-6469 
3418 Enterprise. Ft. 
Pierce, FL 33482 
3-18t-9tpts

GOVERNMENT JOBS 
$16,040 - $59,230/yr. 
Now Hiring. Call 805- 
687-6000 Ext. R-6226 
for curren t federal 
list.
3-20t-16tpts
AN EXPERIENCED 
bartender waitress 
needed, apply in per­
son Muleshoe Country 
Club.
m3-20s-4tc

4. Houses 
For Rent

RUIDOSO CHALET: 4 
bedroom for rent by 
day, weekend. or 
weekly. Call 505-257- 
2622 or 915-943-9021. 
Owner Dr. Albertson. 
a4-49t-tfc
NEED TO rent 3 or 4 
bedroom house in or 
near Muleshoe. Ready 
to move in July I. 
Call Vickie at,
272-7518.
4-2ls-4tp
MATURE responsible 
couple want to rent 2 
or 3 bedroom home. 
Call 247-2871. 
s4-21s-tfc

5. A pts.
For Rent

FOR R L N f  one large 
bedroom apartments. 
Call 965-2188 or 
272-4754. 
s5-|7 t-tfc_

Silence
There is no wholly 

satisfactory substitute 
for brains, but silence 
does pretty well.

-Leader, Garner, la.

328 acres being the' 
E/2 of Section 128. 
Block A* Melvin. 
Blum & Blum. Bailey 
County. Approximate­
ly 300 acres in cult., 
$82,000. 83.6 ac. cot­
ton base 265# yield: 
147.7 ac. sheat base 
18 bu yield: 74.7 grain 
sorghum base 43 bu 
yield. Contact the 
Federal Land Bank 
Association of Mule­
shoe. Ph. 806-272- 
3010. 
fK-16s-tfc
ATTENTION MOBILE 

HOME OWNERS 
Your house is worth 
more now than ever, 
come take advantage 
of low interest rates. 
By trading in your 
house today if you 
have a ’78 model or 
older house it is time 
to trade into a new- 
better built home. We 
need good used 
houses and pay top 
dollar. Call Don at 
A-l MOBILE
HOMES, today at 
763-5319 collect. 
a8-21t-8tc
P.WHFR MOVING! 
MUST SELL! 3 Br. 2 
bath Brick Home. Co. 
Country Club Addi­
tion. Den. FP, Formal 
DR. bookshelves, 2 
car garage with elec­
tric openers. Covered 
patio, trees, fenced. 
Central A&H. 906 
Juniper. 272-5421 or 
(806) 637-6616. 
m8-16t-stfc
480 acres being the 
W/2 and the SW/4 of 
Section 21. Block Z. 
W.D. & F.W. John­
son Subdivision, Bai­
ley County. $216,000. 
Contact the Federal 
Land Bank Associa­
tion of Muleshoe. Ph. 
806-272-3010. 
f8-16s-tfc

40 ACRE HORSE 
FARM  on paved west 
camp road 8 miles 
northw est of M ule­
shoe, in the Muleshoe 
School District. Nice 3 
bdrm. home, double 
garage, barn, corral, 
stalls, metal shop 
bldg. 15 acres of 
permanent grass, re­
mainder in wheat for 
grazing. Good 6“ ir­
rigation well & motor 
& side roll sprinkler, 
plus other various 
pieces of equipment. 
Call Pierce Real Es­
ta te , Texico, N.M. 
505-482.-9188. 

p8-20s-tfc

WEST TEXAS largest 
selections of repos­
sessed mobile homes
2 & 3 bedroom s
available, low low 
down payments, Call 
1-800-792-0032, Must­
ang Mobile Homes. 
mS-lbt-tfc1
TAKE UP payments 
on 1982 3 Bedroom 
mobile home - would 
consider renting-272- 
3693 or 272-3759. 
8-20s-2tp-

3 bdrm, 2 baths, large? 
living room, large di­
ning room & kitchen. 
Calf 1-505-762-2090 
after 10:30 business, 
home 1-505-762-2625. 
p8-21s-stfc

OWNER-REAL nice. 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, 
brick, great location, 
appointments only, 
946-3443. 
r8-18s-stfc

FOR SALE: by owner
3 bdrm, 1 bath, gar­
age, Country Club 
Addition. $35,000.00 
272-5414. 
j8-6s-stfc

REAL ESTATE BRO- 
KERS-The Farmers 
Home Administration 
(FmHA) has from 
time to time various 
inventory Real pro­
perties for sale 
through brokers hav­
ing executed a nonex­
clusive listing agree­
ment with the agency. 
Licensed real estate 
brokers may obtain 
additional information 
by writing or visiting 
the local FmHA Office 
located at 115 E. Ave. 
D. Muleshoe, TX. 
79347 or telephoning 
(806) 272-5549^ *
f8-20t-4tcts

'top quality home
Beautiful custom- 
built. brick home* 
only 6 yr. old! 
Approx. 2500 Sq 
Ft. Living area 
plus enclosed, in 
sulated shop area 
Many extra- walk-in 
closets, custom cab 
intery, sprinkler sy 
stem, 2 covered pa 
tios, beautiful view 
1515 W. Ave. J 
272-5334. 
b8-9s-stfc

> 4 9 .^ ^

t = tMMAl NOMtMStomiwn

Krebbs Real Estate 
1004 W. 6th

Telephone 272-3191 
***

Choice quarter sec­
tion, good terms. 30 
a hog farm, auto­
matic, too cheap.

TWO MULES for 
sale, 3 and 4 years 
old. One saddle 
broke. Call 806-256- 
3659.
11-21 s-2tp
280 shares in Citizens 
State Bank. Earth. Tx. 
for sale. 806-965-2385. 
bl l-21t-2tp
FOR SALE: Brown 
soft vinyl, excellent 
condition, 965-2360. 
mll-21t-2tc

JAMES F. HAYES & CO.
AGRICULTURAL REAL ESTATE

Vic Coker - Agent 
(806) 965-2468

335 Acres-5 miles east of Lazbuddie. 
Pavement on 2 sides. Good soil, good 
water. House & acreage can be sold 
separately.

480 Acres near Lazb-ldie. Very good soils
nnt?*u»cy Ae,ec finklcrs. assumable note. $825/Aere. ^Iil divide.

*•*
668 acres Northwest of Muleshoe Excellent 
water. Very good soils. House barn. 2 
Electric sprinklers, make offer.

8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate

BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY 
116 E. AVE. C 

272-5285—272-5286

COUNTRY LIVING HOMES

3-1-1 home on 1 acre, close to town, nice 
workshop-storage bldg. & attached shed. 
$30’s....

1-3 bdrm. & 1-2 bdrm. homes on approx. 1 
Pavement close to town. PRICED

TO SELL at $32,000!!!!!
•**

3-1-2 home on 1 acre. Cent, heat, storage
cln?S.M o°n .,Pavement close to town. 
$30 s !!! Possible Owner Financing!

RICHLAND HILLS

3-1%-2 Brick, Cent, heat, Evap. air, 
built-ins, nice earth tone carpets, new 
vinyl flooring, fenced yard & lots more!!! 
$60’s • • •
NICE 3-2-2 Brick, (energy Efficient-Total 
Electric). Cent. A&H, built-ins, fireplace, 
storm windows & doors, utility, nice patio 
.& more!!!!I!

IMMACULATE 3-W a-2 Brick. Cent. A&H. 
built-ins. fireplace, fenced yard, storage 
bldg. & more. $50’s!!l

LENAU ADD.

3-1-1 home corner lot. Cent, heat, Evap.
air fenced yard. $30’s......

***
NICE 2-1-1 home, wall furnace, evap. air 
storm windows & doors, utility, fenced
yard & storage bldg. $30’sl!l *«•
•3-1 %-l carport home, nice carpet, fenced 
.yard, neat. $30's!!!!!

•**
2-1-1 home, wall furnace heat, evap. air 
carpeted, fenced yard. $20’s!!!!!

***

HIGH SCHOOL AREA

IMMACULATE 3-1 3/4-1 Brick home
5 Cfl‘ A&H- 2 fireplaces, nice 

finished basem ent, carth tone  carpets 
undergrd . sprinkler. & much m ore’ 
$50’s!!!!!!! e '

see
JUST LISTED-3-\Vt-\ carport home on 
corner lot. wall furnace heat. evap. air 
nice location, close to school. $29,900!!! 

see

NICE 3 - lt l  carport Home on corner lot. 
Nice carpets, wall furnace heat, evap. air. 
fenced yard and storage bldg. $30's!!l

3-1% Brick Home, with approx. 2750 sq. 
ft. of Iv. area, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
beamed ceiling in living room, nice den 
with ash paneling, large utility, fenced 
yard, storage bldg., & more!!!!!

3-1-1 home, corner lot, Cent, heat, Evap. 
air, fenced yard. $30’s!!!

3-1 %-l home, corner lot. Cent. A&H, 
1800+ sq. ft. of lv. area, sprinkler sys., & 
also has a nice 2 room & bath rental unit. 
$40’s!!l 10% Owner financing.

2- 1 home on 20 acres. 20 hp. sub. pump, 
domestic well, large barn & corrals, % 
mile sprinkler pipe, & more. $42,500...

• • •
JUST LISTED-3-2-1 detached garage home 
on corner lot, floor & wall furnace heat, 
evap. air, built-ins, ceiling fans, fenced 
yard, storage, approx. 2450 sq. ft. of lv. 
area. $47,500!!!!!

*•*
JUST LISTED-3-1-1 carport home, wall 
furnace heat, evap. air, gas log fireplace, 2
storage areas, fenced yard. $30’s!H!

*•*
3- 2 home with approx. 1940 sq. ft. of lv. 
area, Cent. A&H. fenced yard, gas grill, 
storage bldg. & more. $30’s!H

***
BUILDING ON 2 LOTS, approx. 2350 sq. 
ft., paved parking...^

PRICE REDUCED-Nice brick office bldg. 
Approx. 4,000 sq. ft. Very nice offices and 
reception area, central A&H paved 
parking.

*«*
KL-Approz. 400 acres. 4 wells, under­
ground tile. 3-1 %-2 home. 2 large bams. 
2-1 tenant house. $750.00 per acre.

•**
FAIR VIEW AREA-2 good dryland labors 
on pavement. Priced to Sell!!!!!

JUST LISTED 3-1'/a home. Cent. A&H. 
built-ins. fireplace, fenced yard. 16* x 32’
insulated workshop-garage. $40’s!!!***
JUST LISTED-3-1-1 home on corner lot. 
Cent. heat. evap. air. earthtone carpet, 
fenced yard. $20’s!!!

“ WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS” 
GEORGE NIEMAN. BROKER 
DIANNE NIEMAN. BROKER

11. For Sale 
Or Trade

2-1
improvements

JIMMIE CRAWFORD 
Real Estate & Ins. 

1725 W. Ave. E 
Muleshoe. Texas 
Phone 2 7 2 - ^ 6

%-2 brick housPwjfftJ^*.
Ui>*e country home.

Home.

Teres with many

•**
4-1 house on 18 acres 9 Mi. N.E. of town.
Lots of barns. Make offer.***
3-1 %-2 stucco hoi 
Chain link f e n ^

***
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY- 3 lots on 
highway 84 with 125’ frontage west of 
town.
Have other dryland & irrigated farm 
listings. Call for more details.

lOiV ursing
t f ^ o r a g e  Bldg.

WHrrr-RHD
Real Estate & Insurance 

1201 Main - Ph. 272-3(11

•  Homes
•  Fame 

•  Ranches 
Commercial

3 bedroom.brick home, Highland Addition.
1% baths, fireplace, over 2000 S.F. living 
space 75x140 ft.'lot, 56,000. 50H9 

•**
3 bedroom, brick home. Park Addition, 1% 
baths fireplace, central heat, evap. air 
over 1850 S.F. storage, fenced, S3,000. 
50H13

•**
3-2 Double carport Brick, huge patio, 
corner fireplace free standing fireplace, 
dishwasher, range-oven, disposal, storage 
building. 50H-4

**•
New Listing 3-1-lfcarport, new comp roof.

Canel rag heat, stucco a good starter 
ome. 0H-11

***
We have several-2 house on one lot, live in 
one rent the other one, or make good rent 
property. Call today.

"If You Want It Sold - See Us"
H.C. Reid Broker 
Roy Whitt 272-3058 
Thunae Reid 272-5318 
Joy Whitt 272-3058 
Lucille Harp 272-4693

HENRY REALTY 
111 W. Ave. B 

Muleshoe, Texas 
272-4581 

•**
COUNTRY living, close to town. A 
3-Bedroom, 2-bath, large den with 
fireplace, central air/heat, located on 
one-acre tract. Carpet through-out, many 
built-in appliances in kitchen. TV-Cable. 
See to appreciate.

***-
4 BR. 2 BATH, 2 car garage, central 
heat/air, large utility, carpet, near down­
town. Excellent condition.

*•*
150 ACRES with 6 inch well and 4 inch 
well. On highway close to Muleshoe. 
Underground line connects both wells 

***
ONE ACRE  sites for home construction 3 
miles East of Muleshoe on HWY 3 lots 
remain.

***
JUST COMPLETED 3 bedroom. 2 bath 
large living room, kitchen and dining

”«“■ "is" school.
•**

COM PLETELY  rejjj.vSjVd 2 bedroom  
home. Ideal f if t^ S N u e . must sec to 
appreciate. O p tio n  with F.H.A. loan.

APARTMENT complex, mobile home park 
abfe0t Und f° r exPansion- Terms fvail- 

***
t i f p E R T Y  on Main 

S tree t, over 4.000 sq. ft inenm r 
producing property. 4 ’ come

**•
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY . Excellent 
rental income from 4 separate offices 
Lease agreements in force. es>

• • •

r ch f e h. r  c:,!ibuilding. Lot 85'x602'8 y' *40 mctal 
•»*

c d g fo , rcm odc" d '
**•

BrirCtyvClub A^ ition • 3 BR . 2 bath -

H/AC. wen7n^uU0t S ew ith>stormdd Ce” traJ  windows. Cai.

Leftover fish is good made '' ■ * * * »
onion. “ "h «<
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Sudan News
by

Evelyn Ritchie
Several Sudan students were 

in Waco during the weekend to 
attend State competition with 
results as follows: placing first 
in woodworking were Ricky 
Tennyson, Kenna Richards, 
Ricky Montez, Fredrick Her­
nandez, George Salinas, Johnny 
Montez, Carmen Ramos, Jesse 
Valero and Eddie Salinas.

Also placing first in drafting 
were Charles K essler, Je ff 
Dodson, Johnny Montez and 
John Harlan. The students won 
second place in Class A team 
competition.

Those who won best of 
division awards in woodworking 
were Johnny Montez, Carmen 
Ramos. Jesse Valero and Eddie 
Salinas.

Second place in woodworking 
went to Star Tennyson and 
Misty Bartley. Winning third

Elace in woodworking were 
avid Wood, Francis Valero, 

Israel Azua, Jeff Taylor, Gus 
Cruz. Robert Azua with his 
clock and also checkerboard.

W inning second place in 
d rafting  were Jeff Dodson. 
Gordon Martin and Ricky Ten­
nyson. Ricky Tennyson also 
placed second in testing.

Placing third in drafting were 
Frank Garza. Manuel Limon, 
Jeff Dodson, Trino Espinoso 
and Dean Richards.

Congratulations go to these 
students for their accomplish­
ments and to their Industrial, 
Arts Instructor, Larry Brother- 
ton.

***

Mrs. Gloria Humphreys ac­
companied Laurie Ann Damron 
to Austin Friday to attend State 
U.l.L. Literary competition. 
Laurie Ann is competing in 
news writing.

•**

D anene Cox, daugh ter of 
Jerry and Linda Cox, was one of 
twelve nursing students who 
a ttended  the annual NSNA 
(National Student Nurses’ As-

a  Real Estate & Real Estate

SMALLWOOD REAL ESTATE 
BROKER

232 Main 272-4838
3 Bedroom, 2 Bath, Stucco all carpeted.

***
3 Bedroom. 1 Bath, Stucco with large 
storage building.

**•

APTS , 2 Bedroom, 2 Bath, Small
downpayment. Owner will finance.

**•
8-9s-stfc

Mk

sociation) convention held in 
New Orleans, La. recently.

The convention focused on 
titling and entry into nursing, 
the image of nursing and 
several focus sessions including 
critical care nursing, neonatal 
nursing, orthopedic nursing and 
many more. Various exhibits 
representing hospitals, schools 
and health care facilities across 
the nation were presented.

Relaxation periods were taken 
advantage of by touring the city 
of New Orleans. Such places 
toured included the French 
Quarters Market, consisteing of 
sidewalk cafes, unique shops, 
elegant restaurants, and public 
jazz concerts. Other tourist sites 
were Bourbon Street, Louisiana 
Bayou cruises, the annual Jazz 
Festival, (featuring the Tempta­
tions) and Natalie Cole and the 
indulgence of hot and spicy 
Cajun foods. A Mardi Gras 
party was held for the nursing 
students on the last night of the 
convention.

Danene. will begin her senior, 
year at M ethodist Hospital 
School of Nursing in Lubbock 
in June.

She is a 1984 graduate of 
Sudan High School and grand­
daughter of Lorene Whittenburg 
of Littlefield and Mr. and Mrs. 
Morris Phillips of Muleshoe.

a*-*--*-
•**

Dennie Harvey of Abilene and 
Cheryll Harvey of Plainview 
visited on Mother’s Day week­
end with their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Halbert Harvey,

**•

Visiting with Mrs. Rene Cole 
on Mother’s Day and attending 
services at FBC Sunday morn­
ing was her daughter.

Ollie White has been released 
from the Am herst Hospital 
where she spent several days 
last week.

J t f
udderth Realty, Inc.

Drawer 387 
Farwell, Tx 79325 
Ph. 806-481-3288

177 acres 
sprinkler irriga ted  with zimmatic 

near Lazbuddie. Good water 
area, Owner says sell.

JUST LISTED AT VERY REASONABLE 
PRICE. Country living at its best, 10 acres 
with very nice family home, lots of extras, 
4 bdrm, 2 ‘/ j  bath, brick, with spacious 
kitchen and dining combo. Extra large 
family room with fireplace, 2 car gargage, 
satellite dish with remote, large stucco 
shop, storm cellar, lots of shade and fruit 
trees, grape vines, barn with fence, 
sprinkler system and aluminum nine to 
w ater acreage . Im m ediate possession 
located west of Muleshoe. Seller savs 
“ let’s get it sold.”

City home with country view very nice 
brick 3 bdrm, 2 bath, 2 car garage, 
fireplace, central heat & refrigerated air, 
underground sprinkler system, must be to 
appreciate owner savs sell.

**•

320 acres irrigated, 2 circle sprinklers, 
excellent home, large steel barn, good 
farm. Owner says SELL IMMEDIATELY.

1 5  M is c .

HOUSE TO BE  
MOVED: Nice 3 bed­
room. call 272-3566 of 
272-4201. 
ml5-17s-tfc

1 6 . L iv e s t o c k

CALL YOUR LOCAL 
Used Cow Dealer for 
7-day a week free 
dead stock removal. 
806-965-2903 collect 1- 
800-692-4435. 
h!6-33t-tfc__________

18. Legals

1 5 . M is c . 1 5  M is c ,

SHOP AROUND FOR THE BEST PRICE 
THEN SEE OUR PRICES 

60% OFF I4K GOLD & DIAMONDS 
EVERY DAY

Bi-Wize Health Mart
902 Main Friona, Texas

247-3010

The Trustees of the 
Muleshoe Indepen­
dent School District 
will offer for sale by 
sealed bid the follow­
ing: three-60 passen­
ger 1975 school buses, 
IHC chassis, carpen­
ter body, one-60 pas­
senger 1976 school 
bus, IHC chassis, car­
penter body. These 
buses may be in ­
spected at the school 
bus barn between the 
hours of 8:00 a.m. 
and 5:00 p.m. Mon­
day through Friday. 
Bids will be opened 
June 9. 1986. at 8:00 
p.m. The Board re­
serves the right to 
reject any and all bids 
in the best interest of 
the District.

Tom G. Jinks, 
Asst. Supt.

Muleshoe I.S.D.
514 West Avenue G 

Muleshoe. TX. 79347 
806/272-3911 

ml8-21s-2tsc

11. For Sale 
Or Trade

11. For Sale 
Or Trade

11. For Sale 
Or Trade

M
91881
21256
24327
92441
72158
88751
88661
65737
14008
33051
74851
15234
4151
4142
91870
21383
21386
21341
21385
21374
53323

SEARS MEMORIAL DAY SALE
May 26 thru 28

Merchandise 
Stereo 
Bun Cabinet 
Vac
E Range 
Gas Range 
Microwaves 
Microwave 
Toast Dryer 
Paint Brushes 
White Paint (Ext) 
Rcfrig 17’
Chest Freezer 23’ 
19” TV 
19" TV 
Stereo
Boom Boom Radio 
Boom Boom Radio 
Boom Boom Radio 
Boom Boom Radio 
Boom Boom Radio 
VHS

All Merchandise Plus Tax & 
Freight.______

Was Now Save
$269.99 $179.99 $90.00
$499.99 $299.99 $200.00
$299.99 each $239.99 $60.00
$449.99 $349.99 $100.00
$489.99 $379.99 $110.00
$419.99 each $339.99 $80.00
$319.99 $249.99 $70.00
$349.99 $279.99 $70.00
$5.99 $5.00 .99
$19.99 $9.99 $10.00
$759.99 $599.99 $190.00
$539.99 $429.99 $110.00
$489.99 $389.99 $100.00
$419.99 $334.99 $85.00
$279.99 $223.99 $56.00
$89.99 $69.99 $20.00
$99.99 $78.99 $21.00
$79.99 $64.99 $15.00
$149.99 $119.99 $30.00
$49.99 $39.99 $10.00
$489.99 $339.99 $150.00

Mrs. Ola Baccus has been a 
patient in the Amherst Hospital 
this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Corley 
of Belen, N.M. visited this week 
with his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
G.C. Ritchie.

•••

The Ruth Sunday School class 
members held their May meet­
ing with a salad supper in the 
Fellowship hall of the FBC on 
Monday night with Frances 
Gardner as hostess.

Frances brought the devo­
tional on “ Mothers” .

Others attending were Mary 
H arper, Gwen W est, M utt
Hana, and Oleta Reece.

***

Visiting on Mother’s Day with 
Mrs. Evan Doty were her son, 
Kelton Doty of Shallowater and 
also Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Doty 
of Sudan.

•**

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Robertson 
and Michael and Lindsay of 
Lubbock visited Sunday with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J.C. 
Doty and were here to observe 
Mother’s Day as well as J .C .’s 
birthday. Joining them were 
their mothers. Evah Doty and 
Mrs. Verdie Gann as well as 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. Craig 
Doty and Kimberly all of Sudan. 

***
Mrs. Bonnie Roberts was in 

Odessa during the weekend to 
attend funeral services for her 
sister, Louise Sullivan.

*•*

Visiting on Mother’s Day with 
Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Knox were 
their sons, Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Knox and Wendy of Abernathy 
and Mr. and Mrs. Chester Knox 
and family of Seminole. They all 
had Mother’s Day dinner in the 
home of their daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Kuykendall and 
family and joining them was
Mrs. Daisy Ford.

***

The First Baptist Church will 
host the Joe Whitten Prison 
M inistries touring choir on 
Wednesday, May 28th. The 
choir is made up of college 
students who tour the various 
prisons throughout America un­
der the supervision of Joe 
Whitten of Big Springs, Texas.

Our own. Perry Kent, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Pat Kent will be 
touring with the group this 
summer.

The prison ministry has seen 
many of the inmates make 
professions of faith as a result 
of the Gospel music presented 
to them by the choir.

The program will begin at 
7:30 p.m. and will last approxi­

mately 45 minutes. Everyone in 
the community is invited to 
come hear this group.

On Friday, June 20th, the 
First Baptist Church will host 
the Continental Singers. The 
concert will be held at 7:30 p.m. 
in the Sudan High School 
auditorium.

The community is invited to 
come and listen to great Gospel 
singing centered around the 
theme “ Lift Jesus Up for the 
World To See” .

There will be approximately 
40 in this choir and members of 
the Baptist Church will be 
hosting the evening meal for 
them. They will be staying in 
different homes for the night 
and then continue on their tour 
on Saturday.

Becky Byerley, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Elray Rasco will 
be touring with the group this 
year.

***

Mrs. David Doty and children 
of Littlefield visited on Mother’s 
Day with Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Doty and they all visited with 
their mother and grandmother, 
Mrs. Evah Doty.

***

Mr. and Mrs. David Quisen- 
berry  and Sarah were in 
Lockney during the Mother's 
Day weekend to visit his

parents. Mr. and Mrs. Danny
Quisenberry and family.

***
Rickey Moore of Ft. Polk, La. 

was home the past few days 
with his family, the William 
Moores and was here to attend 
funeral services Saturday for his 
mother, Yvonne Moore. Also 
visiting and here for funeral 
services were her sister, Chars- 
lie Martin of Alto and her 
brother, W.D. Brown of Hous­
ton.

* «*

Recently visiting with Mrs. 
Joy Logan have been her 
children, Mrs. Linda Hunter 
and children of Amarillo, Mrs. 
Randy Jordan and family of 
Breckenridge and Cary Logan 
and family of Canyon. They also 
visited with their grandparents,
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Day.

***

M r. and Mrs. Roy Don 
Dudgeon of Dimmitt visited 
Saturday with his mother, Mrs. 
Winona Dudgeon.

***

Visiting Saturday with Billie 
Money were friends, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dean Williams of Las 
Cruces. N.M.

***

Mrs. David Doty and children 
of Littlefield visited Sunday on 
Mother’s Day with Mr. and
Mrs. Wayne Doty.

***

STANDOUT
SORGHUM

Toni iwriM a M d of NC+
U u a m m I  nn «> n  aAM w iM Mnyona giow sotgrtuvn-

Bv m Mom4 BLmi Um iMi myltXCetrrm rKHIT n 601111 Oral 
i l l —L v !* L I  »  ■ » * -!m gn twig rOTenTtw-

NC-f-STANDS (HIT ABOVE 
THE REST,

Matt Phelps
925-6485

R t . 5

Surge!! 
Irrigation!!

Wiedebush & Company
272-4611

Pul The MMS, Inc. Surge Tee To Work For You!
It Watches The Water So You Can Do Other Things.

MINIMAL SUNSHINE 
REQUIRED PER DAY 
SUPPORTS THE LOW 
LOAD M M S ,  INC. 

SURGE TEE.

• Surge System Management Of Gated Pipe Water Offers
Something Good For All Concerned.

e TO THI LENDER OF THE PRODUCTION MONEY: Lower 
Irrigation Expenses - Conservation Of Capital.

• TO THE LANDOWNER: Less Water Taken Out Of The
Underground Supply.

• TO THE OPERATOR: Less Expense In Energy, Faster Coverage
Of Ground, Cover More Ground With Available Water,
Less Wear And Tear On Well.

LESS EXPENSE =  MORE PROFIT
SURGE IS REVOLUTIONIZING FLOOD IRRIGATION

M M S  IS REVOLUTIONIZIN SURGE


