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The Vernon Bleekers 'had a 
houseful and had a good time' 
for Christmas. Daughter Von- 
dell was home fromWestTexas 
State University; also visiting 
were another daughter and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Max Horne 
and Donna and Kathy, of Brown­
field; Mr. and Mrs. Henry Mil­
ler of Olton, Mrs. Bleeker’s 
parents; and her sister and 
brother-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Criswell, also of Olton. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Chris Velte, 

and sons Karl and Paul, arrived 
late Christmas Eve to stay until 
Saturday with Mrs. Velte’s par­
ents, Rev. and Mrs. J . Waid 
Griffin.

* * * * *
The annual Christmas dance 

for the youth of the Muleshoe 
area will be held Saturday night 
at American Legion Hall, start­
ing at 8:30 p.m.

Playing will be The Brutes, 
a musical group from Lubbock. 

* * * * *
Spc. Gary Middlebrooks a r ­

rived Friday December 18 to 
visit with his father Tootie Mid­
dlebrooks and family until Sat­
urday. He has been stationed at 
Fort Lewis, Washington about 
three months.

* * * * *
Mrs. Bonnie Harlin, Mr. and 

M is. Lewis S eders t» ’.Yew. 
Camp, and Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Hukill of Dallas attended a 
Christmas get-together and 
family reunion of the W.J. Hen­
derson family in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charley Edwards 
at Ralls.

All seven Henderson child­
ren are living and there are 
24 grandchildren and 17 great­
grandchildren.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Harlin 

and daughters Glenda, Jan and 
Shari are spending the holidays 
with Mrs. Harlin’s parents. 
Rev. and Mrs. A. Edwin Wil­
son, in Chatanooga, Tenn. 

* * * * *

★  ★  ★

Slow-Vehicle Emblem 
Must Gleam Soon

Bright orange and red t r i ­
angles visible more than a fifth 
of a mile away will tell drivers 
they are approaching the rear 
of a slow-moving vehicle be­
ginning the first day of 1970.

The Texas Safety Association 
advises mobile machine owners 
and operators that the new law 
states all vehicles designed to 
travel at speeds of 25 miles an ,
hour or less must have approved C o U F l f V  J u d g e  
emblems *K“ Ko "1‘ •'

value. Nine out of 10 smash- 
ups occured during daylight 
hours on dry highways.

“ We are sure that use of 
SMV emblems will reduce the 
number of this kind of crash 
and have significant benefits for 
highway safety,”  said the TSA 
vice president.
Cont'd on Page 2, Col. 4

m
mi

affixed on the back
five feet above the Asks Informationthree to 

road when on public streets and 
highways. If the emblem on a 
towing vehicle is visible at all 
times, the law exempts the 
machine being towed.

Farm and Ranch Vice Presi­
dent Joe L. Smetana of TSA 
wants Texans to know the new 
law is attacking rear-end col­
lisions by specifying a standard 
emblem easy to see at a safe 
distance both day and night on 
slow vehicles, which include 
farm machinery as well as con­
struction equipment and all 
other mobile objects. Ma­
chinery being pulled by animals 
must also display the slow- 
moving vehicle emblem.

The standard size for em­
blems is 16 inches wide by 14 
inches high. In daylight, ap- 
oroaching drivers will see a 
solid bright-orange luminous 
triangle. At night, only the shiny 
red border will glow brilliantly 
around the invisible sunlight re ­
flector. The eiAplems are 
weather-proof and very ef­
fective wet or dry when kept 
clean.

“ These signs are required in 
addition to any other lighting 
or reflective devices specified 
in traffic regulations,”  Mr. 
Smetana said.

“Two out of three crashes 
involving slow-moving vehicles 
are rear-end collisions, which 
account for two-thirds of 
fatalities and injuries and 70 
percent of property damage

Some lucky baby in Bailey 
County
this world to receive many use

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Berry 
of Richardson are visiting his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. T.W.
Berry, and his brother and 1  ax 
famjly, the Allen Berrys. 1 H l t U H

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. David Wyer 

and daughters, Brenda, Kathy 
and Timmy have been spend­
ing Christmas holidays with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs.
H. Jay Wyer and Mr. and Mrs.
Clyde Waggoner.

* * * * *
Mrs. Ada Morgan and Jane 

Morgan, mother and sister of 
Mrs. Harold Wyer, have moved 
from Austin to the Benson 
home at 7th and Avenue B.

* * * * *
* * * * *

Guests in the home of Mrs.
Allie Barbour Tuesday through 
Friday were her son and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Don 
Barbour, Don and Randy, of 
Denver, Colorado.

Christmas Day they were 
joined by friends from Hous­
ton, Terry and Cliff Edwards, 
who accompanied them back 
to Denver.

* * * * *
Spending Christmas holidays 

in the Harvey Bass home was 
Ronnie Johnson of Dallas. He 
accompanied the Bass family 
to Crosbyton to spend Christ­
mas Day with Mrs. Bass’ par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. O.C. Fow­
ler.

* * * * *
Holiday guests in the Fram.

Ellis home were Mrs. Helen 
Ellis and Miss Berna Ruth Ellis, 
of Amarillo, mother and sister 
of Frank Ellis.

* * * * *
Holiday guests in the Scott 

Swafford home were their 
daughters and their families,
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Morris,
Lynette and Patti, from Plain- 
view, and Mr. and Mrs. Por­
ter Swafford and Patti from 
Peru, Indiana.

Christmas Day Jack Morris 
and daughters flew to Maypearl,
Texas to spend part of the holi-

Cont’d on Page 2, Col. 3

On Redistricting
At the December 8 meeting 

of the county commissioners 
court, Lee Pool requested that 
Bailey County redistrict its four 
precincts according to popula­
tion. He made the request for 
the commissioners to redistrict 
in compliance with the ‘one- 
man, one-vote’ Supreme Court 
decision.

County Judge Don Cihak wrote 
letters to 24 counties following 
the meeting. The 24 counties 
had redistricted and Judge 
Cihak requested information on 
the procedure each county used 
to determine the redistricting of 
their precincts.

Letters he has received from 
county judges in various coun­
ties stated that most of them 
faced geographical problems 
but have managed to redistrict 
on the basis of population. The 
general consensus by the ma­
jority of writers indicated that 
county judges did not re­
commend appointing a study 
committee to redistrict but 
pointed out that the commis­
sioners themselves should set 
the redistricting lines them­
selves.

One interesting event re ­
garding redistricting took place 
in Nacogdoches County re ­
cently. “Southwestern Law” 
reported that “ District Judge 
O'Neal Bacon on September 29 
ordered the four commis­
sioners and the county judge of 
Nacogdoches County to jail un­
less they purge themselves of 
contempt by November 6.

"Judge Bacon, a resident of 
Newton, ruled that the com­
missioners court were in con­
tempt of court for falure to

is"all set to arrive*in comP1y wlth a writ of mandamus 
ordering them to redistrict

R o o k in g  to the year ahead, with the 
hope that we may venture a step forward 

on the road to Peace among all men.

Extensive Program 
Planned By SWPS

New Year Babv

Gifts

ful gifts. More than 
merchants will give various 
gifts to the new arrival and 
his or her parents.

There are a few minor rules 
to be followed in order to be 
eligible for the gifts. The baby 
must be born after midnight, 
December 31 and be born in 
Bailey County. By January 15, 
the Journal must have the time 
and place of the birth; sex and 
weight of the baby; names of 
the baby and its parents and 
home births must be reported 
withing 38 hours to the Journal.

Some of the gifts to be pre­
sented and the merchants in­
clude: Infant seat, Cobbs; one- 
half case baby formula, L & K 
Grocery; $5 savings account. 
F irst National Bank; first pic­
ture of baby, Morris Nowlin 
Studio; Mexican dinner for par­
ents, El Nuevo Leal's Resta­
urant; hanging diaper stacker, 
Anthonys; Playtex baby nurser; 
Western Drug; Shampoo, set and 
haircut for mother. Main Street 
Beauty Salon; one day free room 
service. West Plains Memorial 
Hospital; three boxes Pampers, 
Jim 's Pay and Save Grocery; 
free dinner for parents. Cross- 
Roads Cafe; $5 savings account, 
Muleshoe State Bank; diaper 
pail, Perry’s; baby walker. 
Western Auto; one dozen dia­
pers, St. Clairs; infant quilt, 
Fair Store; one case baby food, 
Piggly Wiggly; free dinner for 
parents, Corral Restaurant; one 
case Gerber’s baby food, 
White's Cashway; a free din­
ner, Dinner Bell Cafe; Infants 
training chair, Gibson’s and a 
$5 savings account, Tri-County 
Savings and Loan.

20 local commissioners precincts.’’

More than $25,000,000 will 
be invested in new plant and 
equipment in 1970 to meet the 
needs for electric power in its 
45,000 square mile service 
area, it was announced today by 
Roy Tolk, president of South­
western Public Service Com­
pany.

The major project in the 
1970 construction program will 
be continued construction on 
Jones Station, a new generating 
station located on the Texas 
South Plains, near Lubbock. 
Ground was broken earlier in 
1969 on the new plant, which 
will have an original generat­
ing capability of 210,000 kilo­
watts, and is scheduled to go 
into operation in mid-1971.

Aproximately $2,500,000 of

the 1970 improvement in­
vestment will go for new fac­
ulties in the Plains Division 
of the company, made up of 
communities in eight Texas and 
two New Mexico counties in­
cluding Muleshoe;

“ When it comes to electric 
service, people are mainly con- 

aed about two things these

Sorghum Growers 
Set Advisory Groups Father Rousseau

The Texas Grain Sorghum 
Producers Board has asked the 
assistance of the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service in 
its effort to establish an ad­
visory committee in the 29 
county High Plains area.

The committee was proposed 
by the TGSPB immediately after 
the Board members were 
elected in early October in 
order to give the Board broader 
representation and to develop 
a closer working relationship 
between the Board and local 
producers.

Extension Service District 
Agricultural Agents BUly C. 
Gunter of Lubbock and W.W. 
Grisham, J r .  of AmarUlo 
pointed out that they would en­
courage all county agricultural 
agents in the 29 counties to 
consult with their County Pro­
gram Building Committees on 
the appointment of advisors to 
the TGSPB.

“ It is hoped that the Crops 
Subcommittee of each County 
Program Building Committee 
will select one producer as an 
advisor,” said Gunter and 
Grisham. “ This individual 
would then serve in an advisory 
capacity from that particular 
county to the 12-man Board. 
We would also encourage the 
Crops Subcommittee to Invite 
a representative of the Board 
to present an annual report and

Catholic (Ihurchdiscuss other matters involving!1 
the TGSPB.”

K.B. Parish of Springlake, p i  M S l lC i  n n
chairman of the Board, in ex- I  I d I I »  I f l l S h l U I I  
plaining the advisory committee _ _ . .
pointed out, “ This program is E O P  T i l l  l f k^ l l i f e f k 

farmers, directed by far- 1 1 ,1  i T B m '  M U Mfor
mers, and we feel this com­
mittee will play an active and 
important role in our admini­
stration of research and mar­
ket development. We want to 
assure each grain farmer that 
his Investment will work to 
give the best possible return.”

The TGSPB was formed fol­
lowing the passage of a re ­
ferendum for assessing five 
cents per ton on grain sor­
ghum produced in the area. 
These funds will be used in 
programs of research, disease 
and Insect control, education 
and promotion designed to en­
courage efficient production, 
marketing and use of grain 
sorghum. This program is de­
signed to ultimately improve 
the net income position of grain 
farmers.

The Board is made up of 
area producers elected to the 
responsibility of administering 
these funds for programs which 
tt believes most vital to grain 
sorghum producers on the High 
Plains.

Counties governed by the 
Board include Armstrong, Car- 
Caot’d on Page 2, Col. 3

According to the Reverend 
Father Robert O’Leary, pastor 
of the Immaculate Conception 
of Mary Catholic Church in 
Muleshoe, a well-known Fran­
ciscan Missionary, Father 
Junian Rousseau, from Pena 
Blanca, New Mexico, is to con­
duct a program of spiritual 
renewal, or Parish Mission, 
in the church here, from Jan­
uary 4-January 18, and at the 
Earth Catholic Church from 
January 18-25.

The main service, consist­
ing of Biblical sermons, 
prayers, and hymns, will take 
place every evening, Sunday 
through Saturday. There will 
also be a brief service, consist­
ing of Mass and meditation, 
every morning, Monday through 
Saturday. A special program for 
the school-age children will be 
carried out by the missionary 
on Monday. Tuesday and Wed­
nesday. From January 4-11 the 
services will be in English 
and from January 11-18, the 
services will be in Spanish. 
At Earth, the services will be 
in Spanish.

ont’d on Page 2, Col. 3

days, reliability and cost. We 
share these concerns with our 
customers. That’s why it has 
been necessary for us to in­
vest an average of 20-million 
dollars a year in new equipment 
every year for the last ten 
years. New equipment im­
proves reliability, adds to ef­
ficiency, and, thus, gives us 
a chance, at least, to fight 
galloping inflation,” Tolk said 
in announcing the construction 
program.

“Reliability of electric ser­
vice is not a national problem, 
although it has been made to 
sound like one in recent years. 
This fear atmosphere, which 
has been building since 1965, 
has been largely the product of 
advocates of government con­
trol of business, even though 
the failure which set off the 
1965 blackout originated on a 
governmentowned electric sys­
tem.

"There are a few areas of 
the country, none of them close 
to this region, in which some 
power shortages may develop in 
the future. If these shortages 
do come about, one of the rea­
sons will be that some 
companies have been prohibited 
from building necessary plants 
and transmission lines by 
special interest groups - a 
handful of people. It sometimes
Cont’d on Page 2, Col. 4

Three Students 
On Scholarships 
From Muleshoe

(Special to the Muleshoe 
Journal)—Three Muleshoere- 
sidents are among nearly 1000 
scholarship recipients at Abi­
lene Christian College.

Shirley McColum, daughter of 
J.S. Smallwood, is a special 
student at ACC.

Anita O’Hair, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert O'Hair of Route 
Four, is a junior music educa­
tion major.

Mickey Wilson, son of Mrs. 
Gladys Wilson of 121 West 
Avenue D, is a junior mathe­
matics major.

Scholarships are awarded on 
the basis of academic achieve­
ment, character and need, said 
a spokesman for Abilene 
Christian College. ‘

First Six Months 
Are Spotlighted

Following a bond election on September 10, 1968, construc­
tion highlighted 1969, with many projects completed, not only 
for the city and county, but various individual merchants who 
built or enlarged existing structures.

The first six months of 1969 are highlighted below; and the 
second six months; highlights will be in the following issue 
of the Journal.

JANUARY
Julio Rosalez, son of Mr. and Mrs. Lonnie Rosalez, was 

Bailey County's first baby of the year. The young man was 
born on January 5 at West Plains Memorial Hospital. He and 
his parents were recipients of many gifts given by Muleshoe 
and area merchants.

Muleshoe High School Fine Art Department’s presentation of 
‘Oklahoma’ was well-received by large audiences both nights 
it was given. The all-star cast gave a ‘top’ performance in the 
annual musical.

Richard Duane Rush, 22 and Odell ‘Pee Wee’ Howard, 19, 
both of Muleshoe, and Cecil Lee Mooney, 23, Sudan, were 
assessed 25 year prison terms for the murder of John Everett 
Knox of Sudan. Knox was beaten and robbed at his home on 
March 3, 1968 and died in ambulance enroute to a Littlefield 
Hospital.

Lampe Construction, Co., Lubbock, was awarded a bid for 
construction of the Bailey County Law Enforcement Center. 
The total bid submitted was$121,485.SouthernSteel,San Antonio, 
was awarded the jail equipment contract. Their bid was $43,134.

Muleshoe State Bank purchased $405,000 in General Obliga­
tion Bonds from the City of Muleshoe. This allowed city officials 
to begin an extensive building program in Muleshoe.

FEBRUARY
The Bailey County Water Association was formed and officers 

named for the new organization.
More than 200 entries were received for livestock showings 

in the annual Bailey County Junior Livestock Show, This 
boosted entries to an all-time high for the annual show.

Dr. Charles Allen, minister of the First United Methodist 
Church, Houston, spoke to more than 300 people at the annual 
Chamber of Commerce Banquet. Donnie Carpenter was named 
‘Blue Ribbon Farmer’ at the banquet. Incoming and outgoing 
directors were honored.

Whitt, Watts and Rempe implement Co. was the only Muleshoe 
firm burglarized in a rash of area burglaries. Various firms 
in Sudan were hard hit in the outbreak.

The borad of directors of the Earth-Springlake Hospital 
District called for an election to abolish the district. The election 
was slated for April 2.

MARCH
Pat Bobo, Muleshoe attorney, was named financial chairman 

of a drive to be conducted by the Muleshoe Hospital Auxiliary. 
The drive will be to obtain funds for furnishings for a new wing 
being built at the Muleshoe Nursing Home.

Muleshoe School Athletic Director Dick Stafford submitted 
his resignation to be effective April 1. F red Hedgecoke, McLean 
coach was chosen by the school board to replace Stafford.

Kenneth Heathington, ofHeathington Lumber Co., announced his 
candidacy for Place Three on the Muleshoe City Council. In­
cumbent Irvin St. Clair had announced that he would not seek re- 
election.

Aubrey Heathington, Bailey County farmer, joined his brother, 
Kenneth, in the local political circle when he announced that he 
was a candidate for election to the Muleshoe Independent School 
District School Board.

Muleshoe City Councilmen gave a nod of approval to a bid 
submitted by Jake Diel Dirt and Construction Company for 
paving and improving Muleshoe streets. The voters of Muleshoe 
gave approval for the extensive paving program in a bond 
election on September 10, 1968,

The first major snow of the winter left up to 12 inches of 
welcome snow on the ground. Drifts up to five feet were noted 
in the area.

Bill Loyd, Plains banker, was named president of the Muleshoe 
State Bank. W.Q. Casey was retained as Chairman of the Board 
and the resignation of J.P . Shelton, executive vice president, 
was approved.

Jerry Hutton, son of Mr. and Mrs. Horace Hutton, was named 
manager of the Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce. A lifetime 
resident of Bailey County, Hutton was operating a Texaco 
service station at the time of his appointment to the new post.

APRIL
Lampe Construction Co., Lubbock, was awarded the contract 

for construction of a new city hall in Muleshoe. The company 
submitted a bid of $89,212 to build the 5,052 square foot build­
ing. The city hall will also have three offices for the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce.

Kenneth Heathington and Frank Ellis are unchallenged on 
their bid for the Muleshoe City Council and W.E. ‘Jinks’ Myers, 
Eugene Black, W.M. Pool n  and Aubrey Heathington are vying 
for Places on the Muleshoe Independent School District School 
Board.

New progress for Muleshoe has been noted with a new Church 
of Christ to be built at 16th and Avenue D. E.T. Ford is the 
contractor. Whitt, Watts and Rempe Implement Company an­
nounced plans to build a new 15,000 square foot building 
in the 1400 block of West American Boulevard.

Area law enforcement officers were honored by local business 
and professional people. Bob Price was guest speaker at the 
ceremony.

David Watson, sixth grader, and son of Mr. and Mrs. W.T. 
Watson, spelled down Sheryl Bass, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
E.A. Bass, to win the annual Bailey County Spelling Bee.

After 48 years contlnous service, the post office at Bailey- 
boro closed its doors. W.H. ‘Bill’ Huckabee had operated the 
post office at his grocery store for many years.

El Jacalito - the Little Hut, was opened by Noe Anzaldua on 
Main Street. The restaurant features a full Mexican food menu.

The Muleshoe School Board vetoed a request by several parents 
for a Junior-Senior prom. A petition had been signed by more 
than 40 people requesting the prom.

The Jimmy Pitcock family of 1914 Avenue H was named 
‘Library Family of the Year.’ The honor is sponsored by the 
Muleshoe Study Club.

Bailey County Feeders, Inc., five miles west and one and 
one-half miles south of Muleshoe began an expansion program. 
They planned to expand their operation to feed 6,000 head of 
cattle in the custom feeding operation.

MAY
Coach Bob Graves was named ‘Outstanding Young Educator’ 

at the Texas State Teacher Association spring banquet.
Cont’d on Page 2, Col. 1
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A late evening tornado left a wide swath of damage and de­
struction when It struck the community of Earth. Although 
homes and businesses were damaged and destroyed, no deaths 
or injuries were reported.
A spectauclar fire destroyed a storage area at the Art Loft 

and Swap Shop. Towering flames attracted a large crowd, a l­
though the monetary loss was slight.

Water surrounded Muleshoe on three sides following heavy 
rains. Numerous roads and highways in the area were closed 
by the impromptu flood.

Vina Bass was named valedictorian and Kathy Williams 
salutatorian for the 1969 graduating class. Graduation was 
set for May 27.

Wild weather continued to wallop the area, as hail, wind, rain 
and roaming tornadoes belted the county and caused farmers to 
cast wary eyes skyward daily.

The 1968-69 eiditionof the ‘Mule Train’ Muleshoe High School’s 
annual, was dedicated to Kerry Moore, Muleshoe English and 
Fine Arts teacher.

JUNE
Record entries proved the Jaycee Golf Tournament was 

highly successful. Muleshoe, Hereford, Friona, Farwell and 
Clovis were represented in the tournament.

Jan Creamer. Debt Rogers and Becky Sain were the first 
three entries in the Miss Muleshoe contest. Ann Douglass, 
Tanya Cherry, Cynthia Harris, Deborah Williams, Treena 
Bryant, Gayetta Gable, Pamela Morphis, Karen St. Clair, 
Maralyn Lewis, Lana Moore and Kathy Darsey signed up later for 
the contest. Treena Bryant was named Miss Muleshoe for 1970.

Mltzi Altman was named Little Miss Muleshoe for 1970 
from a field of 12 contestants.

Cloys Wayne Stanberry, 31, was killed, apparently instantly, 
in an explosion at Sherley-Anderson Grain Company at Laz- 
buddie. Two other men received injuries in the blast.

Southern Bailey County received heavy damage to young 
crops in a devastating hail storm. Cotton crops were all but 
wiped out and grain sorghum received varying degrees of 
damage. The Muleshoe National Wildlife Refuge buildings were 
heavily damaged, with loss of windows, side boards and water 
damage. The loss of small wildlife was extensive.

Clyde Holt, longtime Muleshoe service station operator and 
wholesale distributor, announced plans for construction of anew 
service station at his present station site at the intersection 
of Highways 84-70.

Aiswers To Who Knows
1. There is no single language. 

The official languages are 
French,German and Italian.

2. Race destruction.
3. Treason.
4. The ship.
5. A snorkel submarine
6. Nasalcatarrh or common cold.
7. Thomas Jefferson.
8. The straw-colored liquid part 

of the blook—the remaining 
part when the red and white 
blood cells are removed.

*****
It is always difficult to work 

when you have something else 
one your mind.

Cont’d From Page 1

lays with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.L. Morris. They were to 
return to Muleshoe Friday. 

* * * * *
Mrs. F.L. Wenner had all 

of her children and all of her 
grandchildren “ home for 
Christmas’’. They were her sod 
Ralph Wenner of San Diego, 
Calif.; Rev. and Mrs. E.L. Mer- 
riott of Littlefield; Mr. and 
Mrs. Gilbert Wenner of Hub, 
Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Merriott 
of Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. Del- 
ter Wenner and Mr. and Mrs. 
Reaford Wenner and family of 
Lazbuddie; Mr. and Mrs.Ronald 
Ashford of Canyon, Mrs. Eva 
Ashford, Mr. and Mrs. Ansel 
Ashford and family and Mr. 
and Mrs. Lonnie Merriott of
Muleshoe.

* * * * *
Mrs. Sam McKLnstry is 

spending the holidays in Lov- 
ington visiting her daughter and 
family, the Kenneth Osbornes. 

* * * * *
Visiting over the holidays 

in the home of their mother, 
Mrs. Gladys Wilson were 
Mickle Wilson, a student at 
Abilene Christian College, and 
James and Diane Brown of 
Stratford.

* * * * *
Guests in the Frank Hinkson 

home for the holidays are their 
sons, Mike and Frank, home 
from New Mexico State Univer­
sity at Las Cruces.

* * * * *

WHO KNOWS?
1. What is the single language 

of the Swiss?
2. What does the word “ geno­

cide”  mean?
3. What is the only crime men­

tioned in the Constitution’
4. Which moves faster, a motor 

vehicle at 30 miles an hour, 
or a ship at 30 knots?

5. What type of vessel is called 
a “ guppy” ’

6. One person out of ten suffers 
from coryza; what is it?

1 . Which ex-president organized 
the University of Virginia?

8. What is plasma’

i *  ^
We Will Be

I CLOSED
|  THURSDAY, JANUARY 1 |

IN  O BSER V A N C E O F

NEW YEAR’S DAY

MULESHOE 
STATE BANK

|  MEMBER FDIC

Church...
Cont’d From Page 1

Father Julian, far from being 
a stranger in this area, ex­
plained Father O’Leary, has 
been preaching missions or re ­
vivals, in both English and 
Spanish, throughout the south­
west for the last 17 years. 
Originally from Escanaba, 
Mich., he spent many years 
preparing himself for this work 
as a priest and missionary, by 
studying scripture, philosophy 
and theology. He studied in 
various colleges in Michigan, 
Ohio and Indiana. Born June 
23, 1909, he was ordained to 
the priesthood on June 8, 1939.

Together with the Pastor, the 
Rev. Father O’Leary, the visit­
ing missionary cordially ex­
tended an invitation to all 
Christians of this area, both 
Catholic and non-Catholic, to 
attend the inspiring services.

Sorghum...
Cont’d From Page 1
son, Castro, Dallam, Deaf 
Smith, Hansord, Hartley, 
Hutchinson, Moore, Oldham, 
Parmer, Potter, Randall,Sher­
man Bailey, Briscoe, Cochran, 
Crosby, Dawson, Floyd, Gaines, 
Hale, Hockley, Lamb, Lubbock, 
Lynn, Swisher, Terry and Yoa­
kum.

NEW B U S IN E S S  
O FF IC E  H O U R S !,

8 A.M. • 5 P.M. 

MONDAY -  FRIDAY

CALL
272-4578 DAY 
272-4696 AFTER HOURS

5 L . E C T M C

JIIGHUEPOSITOR^

Front Of Building 
230 Main 
Muleshoe

Mrs. Carrie Lee Bishop of 
Kingsville arrived December 
20 to spend Christmas holidays 
with her daughter and family, 
the Jack Schusters.

Mrs. Bishop’s son and family, 
the Jim Bishops of Oklahoma 
City, arrived Christmas Day 
to be with her and the Schus­
ters. They will also visit while 
here with Mrs. Jim Bishop’s 
mother, Mrs. Matilda Slem- 
mons who is expected to a r ­
rive home from Abilene Satur­
day after spending Christmas 
with her son and family, the 
Sen Slemmons.

* * * * *
Mrs. Jackie Tate spent 

Christmas visiting relatives in 
Kilgore.

* * * * *

SWPS...
Cont’d From Page 1

appears to met that we have 
quite a few people living in 
this 20th Century who want all 
the comfort and convenience of 
the space age, including low cost 
electric power, but want the 
landscape to look the way it 
did at the time of the landing 
at Plymouth Rock, with no 
cities, no railroads or airports, 
no highways and now power 
lines,” Tolk added.

Tolk asked the press to help 
draw the distinction between 
a “ Blackout” and an “ outage” . 
He described a “ blackout” as 
a shortage of power and an 
“ outage” as a service inter­
ruption caused by some other 
reason than a power shortage.

“ Let me say, too, that we 
won’t have any blackouts in our 
service area in 1970, but we 
will have some service inter­
ruptions. We aren’t perfect yet, 
our reliability record is 99.997, 
and there will be some times 
when we’ll have all the power 
anybody needs, but there’ll be 
a lightning storm or a squirrel 
in a substation or an equip­
ment failure or a human fail­
ure, and we’ll have a service 
interruption for some of our 
customers. So, interruptions, 
yes; insufficient power supply 
and blackouts, no,”  Tolk con­
cluded.

Southwestern Public Service 
Company’s 45,000 square mile 
service area covers parts of 
four states, beginning in the 
southwest corner of Kansas, 
crossing the Oklahoma and Tex­
as Panhandles, moving down on 
to the South Plains of Texas 
and then west to include the 
Clovis-Portales and Pecos Val­
ley regions of New Mexico.

The company meets the elec­
tric service needs of its 220,000 
customers with an intercon­
nected generating and trans­
mission system that has a gen­
erating capability of 1,820,200 
kilowatts, more than twice what 
it was 10 years ago, and is tied 
together by a 4400 mile trans­
mission line network.

Emblem...
Cont’d From Page 1

Vehicles and mobile ma­
chines being used on the job 
and within the limits of a markeo 
construction or maintenance 
area may operate minus em­
blems, but once on the public 
road they must display theSMY 
emblem.

Twenty other states have laws 
providing for the use of the 
SMV emblem.

*****
You can never tell from the 

way a woman smiles at you what 
I she is thinking of you.

Breeding Bulls 
Are important
Say Specialists

Reproductive efficiency later 
on will be the direct result of 
the cattleman’s choice of herd 
sires during the fall buying 
season, according to J . R. 
Beverly, Extension animal re ­
production specialist at Texas 
A & M University.

“ During fall months when 
bulls are being purchased and 
prior to the beginning of the 
breeding season, producers 
need to consider the importance 
of evaluating the breeding cap­
abilities of their bulls,”  
Beverly says.

It is often said that the bull 
is half the herd, while in fact 
he is more than half, Beverly 
asserts. He explained that 
one bull is usually mated to 20 
to 30 cows per season which 
makes him much more impor­
tant than any single cow. Re­
search from a Miles City, Mont, 
experiment station shows that 
conception rates in single-sire 
herds can range from 45.5 to 
93.9 percent, which emphasizes 
the need for identifying and 
culling poor breeding bulls.

Any evaluation of a bull’s 
breeding capabilities should 
include a careful appraisal of 
semen quality and check for 
physical defects and ailments, 
says Beverly. Semen should 
be secured by electroejacula­
tion and then examined micro­
scopically. The bull can then 
be classed as either satisfac­
tory, questionable or cull. Sat­
isfactory is reserved for bulls 
which can be expected to settle 
at least 60 percent of the cows 
served. On questionable bulls, 
the conception rate will 
probably be below 50 percent. 
Cull bulls have poor semen tests 
or obvious physical defects 
with little or no chance of re ­
covery.

The physical examination 
should include the general 
health and appearance of the 
animal. While not directly 
related to fertility, the con­
dition of the feet and legs will 
definitely affect the mobility 
of the bull, according to 
Beverly.

A last consideration is the 
libido, or sex drive, of the 
animal. There is no labora­
tory test for this trait, so 
the bull must be observed.

“ The bull that was a sat­
isfactory breeder last year may 
not be a satisfactory bull this 
year,” Beverly says. Annual 
checks are a necessity and 
periodic observation during 
the breeding season is also 
advised. He adds that bulls 
purchased and tested at dis­
tant locations should be retested 
after an adjustment period to 
determine the amount of stress 
caused by hauling.

G O LD E N  G LEA M S

Breaking of an oath, and lying. 
Is but a kind of self-denying.

-Samuel Butler.
A man had rather have a 

hundred lies told of him than one 
truth which he does not wish 
to be told.

-Samuel Johnson.
The man who fears no truth 

has nothing to fear from lies.
-Thomas Jefferson
Sin has many tools, but a lie 

is the handle which fits them 
all.

-O.W. Holmes.

MAJOR INVESTMENT—Southwestern Public Service Company plans a major investment in a
1970 construction program say SWPS officials. The program is the Clifford B. Jones Generating 
Station being constructed on the South Plains near Lubbock. The electric company plans to 
invest more than $25,000,000 in plant and equipment in 1970.

January, 1970

SINGLETON FUNERAL HOM E
2 4  Hour Ambulance Service 

Ph. 272-4574 Muleshoe

"There is  snow on the windowpane 
Framing my room 

And the trees are heavy 
With frosty bloom.”

--Anne Lawler

January, one of the two months a d d e d  to the calendar 
(then ten months) long before the birth of Christ, is the 
first month of the year of the Gregorian Calendar (dating 
from Pope Gregory XIII in 1582). Caesar had set the length 
of the year at 365 days centuries earlier; German Protestant 
states made the change in 1700 and England and the Ameri­
can Colonies in 1752—by act of Parliament.

The mont h  is one of great historical significance for 
Americans. The Battle of Princeton occurred on the 3rd in 
1777. Washington had won a victory in December at Trenton 
but Cornwallis arrived near the city with a larger British 
force and Washington, not wishing to wait and be attacked 
by combined British forces, moved against British units 
holding Princeton and New Brunswick.

He left camp fires burning on the night of the 2nd and oi 
the 3rd engaged the Princeton force at Stony Brook Bridge, 
routing them after an initial setback, and occupying Prince­
ton. Cornwallis advanced and Washington retreated, taking 
up a strong position at Morristown. Cornwallis’ return to 
New York left New Jersey in American hands.

Millard Fillmore, 13th President, was bom January 7th 
at Locke, New York. Jackson Day (the 8th) is a legal holi­
day in Louisiana,commemorating the Battle ofNewOrleans, 
the last battle of the War ofl8T2 ill 1815. Alexander Hamil­
ton was born on the 11th, in 1757, in the West Indies. Ben­
jamin F r a n k l i n  was born on the 17th in 1706 in Boston. 
Daniel Webster was bom on the 18th in 1782 at Franklin 
(formerly Salisbury), New Hampshire.

Robert E. Lee was bom on the 19th at Stratford in Vir­
ginia in 1807 and his great lieutenant, Stonewall Jackson, 
was bom on the 21st at Clarksburg, West Virginia, in 1824. 
Ohio’s first legislature met on the 22nd in 1799. The 26th 
is  Michigan Day, dating from 1837, when Michigan was ad­
mitted to the Union. Doublas MacArthur’s birthday is also 
on the 26th, dating from 1880 (Little Rock) and now a spe­
cial day in Arkansas.

The 29th is Kansas Day, commemorating Kansas’s ad­
mission to the Union in 1861. William McKinley, 25th Presi­
dent, was bom at N iles, Ohio, on the 29th in 1843. Thomas 
Paine’s  birthday was also on the 29th, in 1737. Franklin 
Roosevelt’s birthday was the 30th, dated from 1882; he was 
che 32nd President and the only one elected to the office 
four times.

GUNS GUNS GUNS
25% OFF

All R ifles, Pistols, Shotguns And Accessories 25% O ff.
Sale Starts Monday, Dec. 29 Thru Wednesday, Dec. 31.

PRE INVENTORY SALE!
Remember Texans...You Can Buy And Bring Back To Texas.

Foster’s Gun Shop
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO

NEWS NOTES
HEROIN KILLING TFENS 

New York--Dr. Mi c h a e l  
Baden, N.Y. associate medical 
examiner says as many as 200 
teen-agers have died this year 
from involvement with heroin. 
He stated that more than 900 
persons would die by the end 
of the year in the city.

ON APOLLO 13 
Cape K ennedy-The Apollo 

13 c p c k e t  has begun a final 
testing forthe March 12 launch­
ing of anexpedition to the foot­
hills of the moon's rugged high­
lands. Apollo 13 astronauts 
are James A. Lovell, Thomas 
K. M a t t i n g l y  and Fred W. 
Haise.

POPE MAKES PLEA 
Vatican C ity— Pope Paul VI 

has d e p l o r e d  the failure of 
world leaders to end the wars 
in Nigeria, Vietnam and the 
Middle East. The 72-year-old 
Pontiff also decried the in­
creasing number of priestly 
defection and called this "our 
crown of thorns.”

NEW DI KE PRESIDENT 
Durham, N.C.--Terry Sanford, 

former Governor of North Caro­
lina has been named president 
of Duke University. He suc­
ceeds Dr. Douglas M. Knight, 
who resigned to become a vice 
president in the RadioOorpora- 
tion of America (RCA).

MAXICOAT & SHOPLIFTER 
Minneapolis —Josept Rasin- 

ko, deputy chief of police here, 
says the maxicoat is a great 
boon to shoplifters. He told 
nerchants at a fraud-prevention 
clinic the department approved 
of the miniskirt because they 
"barely cover what they’re 
supposed to cover, let alone 
hiding merchandise.”
RULES AGAINST MADDOX 

Atlanta —A Superior Court 
Judge, Osgood O. Williams, 
has ruled a provision of the 
Georgia Constitution which 
prohibits governors from suc­
ceeding themselves is consti­
tutional. Maddox said the legal 
barrier d e p r i v e d  him of his 
rights under the U.S. Consti­
tution.

TAILCATER CAUGHT 
R o n k o n k o m a ,  N .Y.-M rs. 

Anna Meyer, 64. with a record 
of safe driving, became irrated 
when an automobile followed 
her so closely as she pulled 
out of a supermarket parking 
lot. She pulled into a filling 
station tofind thetailgater was 
driverless; the bumpers were 
locked together.
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Nbws of Our
Servicemen

iV.L. Conklin
MONTGOMERY, Ala.--U.S. 

Air Force Captain Norris L. 
Conklin, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
F.N. Conklin, Rural Route, Mc­
Alister, N.M., has graduated 
from the Air University’s
Squadron Officer School at Max­
well AFB, Ala.

Captain Conklin was specially 
selected for the 14-week pro­
fessional officer course in re ­
cognition of his potential as a 
leader in the aerospace force.

The captain, a C-141 Star- 
lifter pilot, is being reassigned 
to McGuire AFB, N.J., to the 
18th Military Airlift Squadron, 
a unit of the Military Airlift 
Command which provides 
global airlift for U.S. military 
forces.

The 1958 graduate of House 
(N.M.) High School received 
his B.S. degree in mathematics 
in 1962 from EasternNewMex­
ico University. He is a mem­
ber of Pi Kappa Alpha.

Captain Conklin entered the 
Air Force in 1962 and was

A.R. Lnmb<>rt
Jacksonville, N.C.- Marine 

Staff Sergeant Aubrey R. 
Lambert, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
S.A. Lambert of 315 W. 11th, 
Muleshoe, is serving with 
Marine Air Control Squadron 
Five at Marine Corps Air 
Station (Helicopter), New River, 
Jacksonville, N.C.

His squadron provides air 
surveillance and control of a ir­
craft and surface-to-surface 
missiles for anti-air warfare 
in support of Fleet Marine 
Forces, Atlantic.

Ronnie Kemp
Private Ronald D. Kemp, 

husband of the former Andra 
Kay Thompson of Muleshoe, 
received a letter of achieve­
ment recently.

According to the letter 
Private Kemp obtained the 
highest score in his company 
in the Army Training Tests.

Commanding officer Vance 
S. Brown J r . added, “ The 
superior results that you have 
attained is indicative of your 
exceptional interest, ability, 
and devotion to duty. Further­
more, it marks you for many 
more successes in the military 
career you have just embarked 
on.

“ I wish to extend to you my 
personal good wishes and a 
desire for your continued suc­
cess on your future military 
career. May you continue to 
be a credit to your country 
and the United States Army.”

Private Kemp has been home 
on leave. He and Mrs. Kemp 
will leave Friday for Califor­
nia where Kemp will be 
stationed.

commissioned upon completion 
of Officer Training School at 
Lackland AFB, Tex.

His wife, Beckye, is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Raleigh Mason, 1805 W. Ave. 
G. Muleshoe, Texas.

Byron Grant
Jacksonville, Fla. - Navy 

Airman Apprentice Byron H. 
Grant, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
George L. Grant Sr. of Friona, 
graduated from the Aviation 
Electricians School attheNaval 
Air Technical Training Center, 
Jacksonville, Fla.

He studied the fundamentals 
of electricity, electronics, a ir­
craft electrical and instrument 
systems, troubleshooting, and 
repair of aircraft electrical 
parts.

He also received refresher 
courses in mathematics and 
physics.
NOT BAD

It wouldn’t be a bad idea at 
that to put the designers of the 
bathing suit in charge of cut­
ting governmental budgets. 

-Herald, Miami.

W.M.

John Tower
United States Senate
COMMITTEE ON ARMED SERVICES

We are an vitally interested 
in the tax bill provisions as 
they are being finally deter­
mined by Congress. The Senate 
has wrestled with the many 
divergent and complex aspects 
of this bill and I have reported 
to you during the past two week­
ends on some of those which I 
have believed are of prime im­
portance to Texans.

This week I would like to 
discuss three more aspects of 
this legislation including pro­
posed tax treatment of farm 
losses, treatment of foundations 
and treatment of pension funds 
for employes of professional 
service corporations.

The current law enables pro­
fessional service corporations, 
such as doctor groups, law

a
l liana
No-No

PAUL HARVEY

U.S. ARMY, VIETNAM 
(AHTNC) - Army Specialist 
Four William M. Wells, 20, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Cap Lanier, 
Earth, was assigned to the 4th 
Infantry Division in Vietnam, 
November 21 as a helicopter 
mechanic.

BUSINESS S m /Z C E S D Itm O W
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•Crop Hail
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Glen Williams
At The 
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Phone 272-4531

Representing The Strongest 
And The Best Companies.

BERRY
ELECTRIC CO.

ELECTRIC WIRING 
and
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SERVICE

104 E. AVE.B 
Phone 272-3375

W. Q . Casey
GENERAL INSURANCE

Let Our Complete 
Coverage Take Core 

of All Your 
Insurance Problems

Mule'hoe State Bank 
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Ph 2 72-4571

THE MONEY 
YOU SPEND 

AT HOME 
STAYS 

AT HOME!

firms and others, to establish 
pension plans for employes in­
cluding tax deferment on the 
amount placed into the pension 
funds. Under such deferment 
plans, the pensioner pays taxes 
on these funds when he draws 
upon them in his later retire­
ment years and when his an­
nual income is usually some­
what less. This is the same as 
can be done for employes of 
corporations in all types of 
businesses.

The Senate Finance Com­
mittee has recommended a bill 
which would limit the amount 
of tax free funds which could 
be placed into the pension funds 
for professional service cor­
porations, without affecting 
those for other businesses.

In my opinion and in the view 
of the majority of senators, 
this measure constituted a dis­
criminatory action against the 
employes of professional se r­
vice corporations by denying 
them an equal opportunity to 
participate in retirement pro­
grams along with the employes 
of non-professional corpora­
tions.

I co-sponsored an amend-
Some of my best editorials have ended up in the wastebasket 

because, when I got to the end of a tub-thumping, breast­
beating tirade, I could not come up with some constructive 
suggestion for improving the situation.

The marijuana problem is a solution-defying subject, but on 
this I have a suggestion.

As a boy in legally “ dry” Oklahoma it always seemed to me 
hypocritical to outlaw liquor when it was everywhere so readily 
obtainable.

Also, it seemed foolish to deprive the state of a legitimate 
liquor tax while paying that bounty instead to bootleggers.

Recently we have been hearing similar arguments in defense 
of marijuana and in opposition to the laws against it.

I’ve never tried marijuana and do not intend to. I’m having 
so much fun sober I’m afraid that any more “ turned on” I’d 
blow a fuse.

But I have listened with interest to the pretty well balanced 
pro-and-con arguments on the subject.

Now the National Institute of Mental Health has undertaken 
a study of marijuana and its effects and a House education 
subcommittee is holding hearings on drug abuse. They’ll try 
to answer the question of whether marijuana is, in fact, ad­
dictive, and the more important question: whether its use 
leads to the use of “ harder” drugs.

They are going to hear our nation’s top scientific official 
minimize the dangers of using marijuana. Roger Egeberg, 
assistant secretary of Health, Education and Welfare, says 
present laws against marijuana are too strict. He does not 
believe that using majijuana leads to inevitable use of heroin.

On the other hand, investigators will hear (as I have heard) 
from some who consider marijuana a “ devil weed”  which alters 
the brain, triggers psychoses, leads to automobile accident* 
and to the use of more dangerous drugs.

Other doctors Insist that the use of marijuana is a result of 
psychological problems, not a cause of them.

And there is research already conducted for the California 
State Legislature indicating that marijuana is, in all ways, 
a lesser hazard than alchohol.

Therein is the crux of this controversy. Today’s enlightened 
young people are unwilling to accept conspicuous inconsistency 
in moral or legal ultimatums. Bud Wilkinson, President Nixon’s 
special consultant on physical fitness, says “ Young people have 
found out that adult warnings about the dire physical and mental 
consequences of using drugs are simply not true. Thus the scare 
technique has backfired.”

Wilkinson says it’s important that we come up with some 
strictly factual, truthful information about drugs—and separate 
that analysis from the dangers of misusing drugs.

Alchohol and/or drug abuse is bad. I think we can get most 
people of every age to agree to that.

Meanwhile, while competent men conscientiously seek the 
whole truth with a likelihood of subsequently modifying laws, 
marijuana is a no-no because possession or use remains, in 
most states, a felony. So, if only from the standpoint of a jail 
record, it can ruin your life.

SKPTIC TANKA 
A CESSPOOL SERVICE

O tlU IO  -  t t 'A l t E D  -  IN STA LliO

Cestpools - Pier Holes 
Boot Pits Storm Cellars 

Concrete Covea & Turnkey 
Jobs Available

Pump Bases & Spillway

WILSON
DRILLING (0 . 

Dial 272-4180
MobU Ph. 963-2359

C L O V IS  H W Y . M U U S H O i

LI

ment to strike the committee 
language and to continue the 
existing law and a majority of 
senators did agree to that a- 
mendment.

Turning to the farm loss 
provision, I was pleased that 
a majority of senators defeated 
a proposed amendment to limit 
deductions for farm expenses to 
a taxpayer’s farming income 
plus $15,000.

Before the vote on that 
amendment, I was thinking 
particularly of the costly and 
time-consuming procedures for 
developing a heard of breeding 
cattle or the painstaking pro­
cesses necessary for cross­
breeding to develop new plant 
strains. The large expenses 
necessary for this valuable 
farm and ranch work are tax 
deductible and should continue 
to be, regardless of the amount 
of such expenses incurred in a 
single year.

In addition, the amendment 
would have required farmers to 
keep far more detailed financial 
records. It might have even 
necessitated the hiring of ex­
pert financial help which would 
only be yet another burden for 
today’s already hard-pressed 
farmer.

Many Americans have been 
properly concerned over al­
leged abuse of our current tax 
laws by some of our larger and 
better known foundations. I be­
lieve, however, that in the main, 
private foundations are a very 
important part of our national 
fabric and should be encouraged 
to continue their outstanding

work. In many instances, pri­
vate foundations offer for many 
worthwhile projects the only 
alternative to Federal fi­
nancing.

Now Congress has considered 
several methods of using the tax 
laws to force a foundation to 
prove its creditability before 
enjoying the benefits of tax 
advantages. Among these is the 
proposal to require each 
foundation to disburse a cer­
tain amount of its funds in 
order to remain eligible for 
favorable tax treatment.

But there are many valid 
reasons for the trustees of a 
foundation to choose not to make 
a certain minimum disburse­
ment during a given year. These 
may be financial, administra­
tive, or simply a lack of & 
worthwhile project which fully 
merits the financial support of 
the foundation.

Dear Editor
Gentlemen and Ladies:

A note of appreciation for 
your splendid coverage of our 
Christmas program. We ap­
preciate it very much.

We further appreciate your 
willingness to spend extra time 
on your part to come and take 
a picture, which turned out to 
be a mighty good one.

Thanks again, and many 
wishes for a joyful Christmas 
season a successful 1970.

Sincerely yours 
Fred Beversdorf

Gun Control Act Change 
Eases Ammo Record Need

(Dallas, Texas) — It no long­
er is necessary for dealers to 
keep records of certain am­
munition sales, B. Frank White, 
Regional Commissioner for the 
Southwest Region, Internal Rev­
enue Service, said today.

Newly enacted legislation 
eliminates the need for dealers 
to keep records on sales of 
shotgun ammunition, ammuni­
tion suitable only for use in 
rifles, and component parts of 
these types of ammunition. Pur­
chases of ammunition in­
terchangeable between rifles 
and handguns, such as .22 cali­
ber rlmfire ammunition, con­
tinue to be subject to the re ­
cordkeeping requirements. 
Previously, the gun control act 
of 1968, required records for 
all ammunition sales.

Mr. White stressed, however, 
that no other aspect of the act, 
which is administered by the 
Alcohol, Tobacco and Firearms 
Division of the IRS, was changed 
by the legislation.

Persons engaged in selling 
ammunition still are required 
to be licensed under the act.

Anyone under 21 years of age 
cannot purchase handgun am­
munition. However, individuals 
at least 18 can buy rifle and 
shotgun ammunition. Dealers 
must still require purchasers 
to identify themselves if there 
is doubt about their age.

Felons, persons under indict­
ment for a felony, fugitives from 
justice, unlawful users of drugs, 
mental incompetents, and per­
sons under 18 continue to be 
prohibited from purchasing am­
munition of any type.

“ The change in the law af­
fects only shotgun and rifle 
ammunition, and their com­
ponent parts. Dealers still are 
required to keep records on the 
sales of other ammunition, 
specifying the type and quan­
tity of ammunition and iden­
tifying the buyer,”  Mr. 
said.

White
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Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Stephens

G i f t  Wrap, Please
Ttie young people and child­

ren of Progress Baptist Chur.ch 
presented a play, "Gift Wrap, 
Please”, December 19.

The cast was composed of 
Glenda, Tonya and Billy James, 
Connie and Lisa Redwine, Janet 
Ellis, Terry and Debbie 
Purchel, Larry Sexton, Debbie 
Kemp, Debra Morgan and Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Gulley.

Mrs. Lee Embry accom­
panied the group as they sang 
carols.

The Christmas Story from 
the Bible was read by the Rev. 
A.L. Burchel.

The members of the classes 
exchanged gifts. Refreshments 
were served and Santa Claus 
brought bags of fruit and candies 
for the children.

Parents Of The "First” 1970 
New Year’s Baby Born In 
Bailey County Will Receive A

FREE DINNER
From The

Ranch House Cafe

Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Stephens, 
Route 2, Muleshoe, were hon­
ored with a surprise open house 
Sunday, December 21st, cele­
brating their 35th wedding an­
niversary. It was held in the 
home of their son and his wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. Darrell Stephens, 
Route 1, Farwell.

Co-hosts and hostesses were 
other members of the family; 
Marlin Stephens, Muleshoe; Mr. 
and Mrs. Jarrell Wright, 
Friona; Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Stephens, Elk City, Oklahoma; 
and Miss Evelyn Stephens, 
Amarillo.

Among the gifts received was 
a book, given by Mr. and Mrs. 
Hubert Gammons, Route 2, 
Muleshoe. It was prepared by 
members of the family and 
contained a brief history of the 
couple’s courtship, marriage, 
children, and grandchildren.

Refreshments of traditional 
wedding cake, various fruit 
cakes, and fruit cocktail punch 
were served from the gayly 
decorated Christmas red and 
holly green table to the seventy- 
five guests registered during 
the afternoon.

20 Years 
Ago

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Pre­
cure returned last Friday from 
an extended visit through the 
northwest section of the 
country. Some of the places vis­
ited were Reno,Nev.,San Fran­
cisco, Calif., and many others.

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul Gardner over 
the weekend and attending the 
McMurry-West Texas game at 
Canyon were Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Patterson of Littlefield, Buckv 
Everett of Amarillo. Mr. and 
Mrs. Hershel Kimbrel and Mr. 
and Mrs. Trou Keagan, all of 
Abilene. Also attending the 
game with the group were Mr. 
and Mrs. Myron Poop II and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bruce Horseley.

Misses Maurtne and LomU* 
Wilterdtng, students at Mc- 
Murry College, Abilene, spent 
the weekend visiting their par-

wm 30(1 Mrs- MervinWilterding, They had as a guest
a college friend, Miss Pat Mil- 
ler.

W e l c o m e  t o  M u l e s h o e

C lay Feagan
Presenting C lay Feagan, newcomer to Muleshoe. He was associated 
w ith Turbin Irrigation M fg . C o . ,  A m arillo , before moving here. 
Feagan is owner and manager of Curry Motor Freight C o . which 
was formerly the Lang Transit C o . M rs. Feagan (Elsa) is book­
keeper and o ffice  manager for their business. The Feagans live  at 
1911 W A v e .  F,  attend the Church of Christ and Lutheran Church 
and have five  children: Don, San Francisco , C a lifo rn ia , Scott, 
Roby, Texas, Mrs. Cris N ew m ille r, Long Island, N . Y . ,  Mrs. 
Debbie Je ffco a t, Roby and M rs. Jimmy Shields, P la in v iew .

The following firms extend a cordial welcome to the Feagans:

James Crane
S U
^ 0 4 i d A i a i

T i m  4 ^ A
DAMRON 
DRUG CO.

R EX AIL
,08 MAIN Ph.272-4210-

James Glaze Co.
INSURANCE 
REAL ESTATE 
LOANS

MULESHOE 
STATE BANK

MEMBER FDIC

Pictures by Appointment
Bernice Douglas

HONORS PLANNED......A special recognition party will be held
Monday evening at seven o’clock at Pleasant Valley community 
center for John Pitts, Texas 4-H president. Sponsoring the 
covered dish supper and recognition program will be Pleasant 
Valley Social Club and Pleasant Valley 4-H Club. Special 
guests at the party will be all 4-H club members from both 
Lamb and Bailey Counties. Anyone interested, adults or child­
ren, are invited to come and bring a covered dish. There is to 
be a special program and special music.

"Norma Osborn has returned 
to Texas State College for 
Women at Denton. She is maj- 
jring in business and will re ­
ceive her degree in June, 1950.

Muleshoe Study Club met with 
Mrs. Marion Harris, Mrs. John 
Watson was co-hostess. A pro­
gram on Southern Culture was 
given by Mrs. Noel Woodley, 
Mrs. Milton Forbes, Mrs. Pat 
Bobo, Mrs. E. H. Kennedy, Ann 
Woodley, Barbara Douglass, and 
Marion Clark Harris.

Others present were Mrs. E. 
Hart, Mrs. G. 0 . Jennings, 

Mrs. H.D. King, Mrs. A. E.

Lewis, Mrs. Lee Pool, Mrs. 
Buck Ragsdale, Mrs. Homer 
Sanders J r . ,  Mrs. Henry Wil­
liamson, Mrs. Buck Wood and 
Mrs. A. J . Gardner.

In Debt
When Sam was asked how he 

budgeted his income, he replied: 
'•Oh. about 40 per cent for food, 
30 per cent for rent, 30 per 
cent for clothing, and 20 per 
cent for amusement and inci­
dentals.”

"But that makes 120 per cent.”
“ Don’t I know it!”  agreed 

Sam. with a groan.

J e n m n g s  C l a n  

O b s e r v e s  

C h r  i s t  m a s

Mr. and Mrs. O.N. Jennings 
gathered their entire clan to 
themselves this Christmas-"In 
and out, and every day some­
time, and no telling how many” .

Genda and Jerry  Bruns were 
home from Lubbock visiting the 
J.A. Nickels, the Les Bruns 
and the Jennings. Kerma and 
Gene McGuire were home from 
Tech and left the 26th for Dal­
las, their new home. Sunday, 
the 21st Rev. and Mrs. E.M. 
Jennings of Lubbock, brother 
and sister-in-law of O.N. 
Jennings were guests.

Others present Christmas 
Day were their granddaughter. 
Miss Tamara Jennings of Dal­
las, and grandsons and their 
families, Mr. and Mrs. Darrell 
Jennings and Darren ofDeKalb, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bryan 
Jennings of Lubbock; Mrs. J.D. 
Travis of Cone, sister of Mrs. 
Jennings, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Bates Jennings of Lazbuddie, 
and Mr. and Mrs. J.A. Nickels 
and Belinda of Muleshoe.

Christmas Eve night the same 
crowd had supper and a gift 
exchange at the Joe Bates Jen­
nings home. Also present were 
Mr. and Mrs. Charley Justin, 
Mrs. J.B. Jenning’s sister and 
husband.

New Year’s Eve will see the 
same crowd meeting in Cone 
at the home of Mrs. Travis.

Epi pha ny
EDiohanv or Little Christ­

mas, is a holy festival observed 
on January 6 in the Roman 
Catholic, Anglican, and Eastern 
churches. Originally it cele­
brated both the birth and the 
baptism of Jesus. Since the 
fourth century, the day has 
honored especially the meeting 
of the Three Wise Men, or Magi, 
with the infant Jesus. In some 
countries, doorways are 
marked with the initials of the 
Magi to keep evil away.

Twelfth Night is the tradi­
tional English name for the 
same celebration (the twelfth 
night after Christmas). It used 
to be the last day of the cele­
bration which began with 
Christmas.

In the Catholic Calendar, 
Epiphany is an entirely dis­
tinct feast from Christmas, and 
lasts eight days, from January 
6 to 13. This is the ancient 
Church custom even from Eng­
land, where the civil holidays 
ended on January 6. During the 
time of Queen Elizabeth 1, 
Twelfth Night was observed in 
England wun wiiu celebration. 
This custom later died out, 
but special church services are 
still held on the date.

40 Years Ago
Extending seasons greetings 

fron Valley Motor were K.K. 
Smith, L.E. Ragsdale, R.J. 
Klump, R.A. Standifer, Walter 
Witte, W.T. Black, Arnold Mor­
ris , J.C. Burkhead, Buford 
Butts, W.H. Kooms, E.M. 
Moore, Jack Gentry,S.A. Good- 
son, Ed Pavlicek, Choyce Wil­
son, Will Harper, and C.A. 
Goodson.

# ##  #
Announcement was made of 

the sale of Muleshoe Tailor 
Shop by H.C. Edmonds to H.A. 
Towery.

Ira Kay Speck looks like she Just couldn’t
Jddled by Santa Claus at the party Christmas 
hildren’s Center. (Where have I seen those

In West Camp news- "M r. 
Bill Elrod of Muleshoe and Miss 
Annita Waller of this community 
were married at Clovis last 
Sunday morning and left im­
mediately for San Angelo and 

Carlsbad Cavern” .

HEW M S EVt
PARTY

FEBRUARY VOWS PLANNED..... Wedding vows will be exchanged
by Miss Patsy Darlene Wilhite and Michael Joe Camp February 
14 at 5:00 p.m. in Lariat Church of Christ, with Jackie Pope 
officiating. A reception in the home of the bride’s mother will 
follow. Miss Wilhite is the daughter of Mrs. Lonnie Wilhite 
and the late Mr. Wilhite, and the prospective groom is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Camp of Garden City, Kansas. Both are 
graduates of Farwell. Camp is employed by S.I.C. in Lubbock, 
and Miss Wilhite is employed by Dr. C.A. Rosebaugh in Lubbock. 
No invitations are being sent locally.

WELCOME VISITOR........Santa Claus himself called on the
delighted children at the Muleshoe Children’s Center at 3:00 
p.m. on Christmas Eve. He distributed gifts and fruit to the 
children. Pictured with the jolly old jentlemen are Lisa Black, 
Sonny Bennett, Michelle Calas, Rachael Summar, Lisa Bennett, 
Shannon Gray, Starla Black and Rebecca Barber. Not pictured 
was Sandra Day Speck who arrived just after the picture was 
taken. Muleshoe Children’s Center has an enrollment of 37 
with an average attendance of 22.

The Y L Senior Class met and 
organized Wednesday. The fol­
lowing officers were elected: 
president, Dale Buhrman; Sec.- 
Treas., Helene Head; reporter, 
Floy Beller,

# # # #
Miss Elizabeth Hardin of 

Electra spent Thanksgiving with 
home folk.

# # # #
Howard Carlyle was in Ama­

rillo Monday.
# # # #

Jane Bucy spent the weekend 
in Farwell, the guest of Beulah 
Kistler.

# # # #
Y L Items- Misses Helene 

Head and Kathleen Willman 
spent Sunday with Misses 
Bertha Lee and Melvina Boles.

Present were Misses Oleta 
and Alice Wilterding, Zora 
Shofner, Julia Harre, Kathryn 
Wilson, Vera June Bellar, Lena 
Head, Bertha Lee and Melvina 
Boles, Kathleen Willman, Lora 
Go dwin, Helene Head, Lucy 
Goodwin, Helene Head, Lucy 
Robinson, Floy Bellar, Mrs. 
Roy Harre, John Bruton, Mrs. 
Jinks Beller, Emmett and Ear­
nest Parsons, Aubrey Traweek, 
Harold and Earl Hamblin, Rus­
sell and Cecil Buhrman, May­
nard Hupp, Roland Mattieson, 
Earl Robinson, J.T. Shofner, 
Donald and Dale Buhrman, Rob­
bie Clark, Mr. and Mrs. Mer- 
vin Wilterding, Mr. and Mrs. 
Durward Head and Mrs. H.M. 
Shofner.

Mr. and Mrs. MervinWilter­
ding and family, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Durward Head took 
Thanksgiving dinner with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J .J .
Head and family.

I f  Loyal Friends SS Class was 
entertained last Wednesday 

jv night in the home of their tea-
tv cher, Miss Dottie Wilterding. — ----- --------------------- -
£ i . * * * » » * * ¥ * ¥ ¥ * A M M M M M M M A A M M M M M A
j l  a ....
J  * (
t :  f ' s l

Mr. and Mrs. Ramon Delgado 
are parents of a son born Dec­
ember 17 at 3:14 p.m. in West 
Plains Memorial Hospital. He 
has been named Rumaldo.

J O I N  U S  F O R

NEW YEAR’S
2 BANDS

1 Band In The Lounge...1 Band 
In The Ballroom

DNIGHT...FREE
FEET BREAKFAST... _____j f r
PARTY FAVORS... £ f l § f

CHAMPAGNE W $ t
ere w ill be a slight cover charge)

ID AY INNf Clovis,
take your reservations e a rly . Hiwoy 60-70-84

DINING • ENTERTAINMENT
Music By
MANDRAKES

Dancing From 9:30 p.m. 
to 1:30 a.m.

Cover Charge $3 Stag 
$5 Couple.

Come join the fun
this New Yearns Eve 
with us.
THE COPPER PENNY

. . ,1305 Mabry Drive Clovis, N.M.
♦ * * * ¥ ¥ ¥ » * * * * *
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10 0 %  Polyester Fiber 
Fill Mattress Pads

FLAT QUILTED PADS
TW IN ^ 9 4  FULL 

3.59 value A  • 4.79 value 50% FORTREL" 50% COTTON

72"xl04" or 81"x104 
or Bottom Contour"FITTED QUILTED PADS

IN ^ 9 4  FULL 
value ^  « 5.79 value (

^  lOO '̂o polyester fiber filled —  washable, quick 
drying Double sewed binding. Sanforized cover.

Convenient Lay-Away Plan
Loy away is the easy, thrifty way to buy. A small 
deposit, regular payments and it's paid for when 
you need it

Beautiful new multi-color stripe sheets and cases that never need 
ironing. Buy full or twin sizes in top flot or bottom contour sheets at 
the low low white sole price

25 YEAR AWARD........Llndal Murray, manager of C.R. Anthony and Co. in Muleshoe the past
sixteen years, is shown acceding his 25 year service pin from Clyde Davis, vice-president of 
the company. Murray began working for Anthony stores while going to school in Chandler, 
Oklahoma. He is a City Councilman, active in all civic affairs, a member of F irst United 
Methodist Church. He and Mrs. Murray are parents of two daughters, Patti and Susan. 50% CELAN ESE11 FORTREL" POLYESTER, 50% COTTON LUXURIOUSLY SMOOTH

was held at Three Way
this weekend with Three Way 
boys winning first, Bovina boys 
second and Shallowater boys 
winning consolation, with the 
girls it was Shallowater first 
place, Sinyer second place and 
Bovina for consolation. Tues­
day night our Three Way high 
teams played Anton on the home 
court with both girls teams 
losing and boys winning.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Donald 
and daughter from Savanah, 
Georgia spent the weekend 
visiting her parents, the E.T. 
Batteas.

Mr. and Mrs. Rayford Mas- 
ten visited their daughter and 
family the Lamar Pollards in 
Levelland Thursday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Wheeler 
were in Lubbock Wednesday 
shopping.

N EW  M ID -TO N E 
COLORS a * * . Dan-Press Muslins

FULL
SIZE

Mr. E.T. Batteas was a med­
ical patient in Cochran 
Memorial Hospital this week.

Mrs. Johnnie Wheeler visited 
her son and family the Joe 
Wheelers in Floydada Monday 
and Tuesday.

S/Sgt and Mrs. Charles Lati­
mer and son from Omaha, Ne­
braska are visiting his par­
ents the W.E. Latimer’s.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kelley 
have returned home after a 
two month visit with their 
daughter and family the Jim 
Emersons in Wilcox Arizona.

Mr. and Mrs. Gib Dupler 
and family and Mr. and Mrs.
Bill Dupler and girls spent 
Sunday in Sundown visiting their 
sister and family the Luther 
Edwards.

Mrs. A.E. Robinson left Wed­
nesday for Hemstead to visit 
her daughterandfamilytheRev. 
and Mrs. Louie Self.

Jackie Dupler son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leon Dupler is home 
for the holidays. Jackie is a 
student at Texas A&M college.

Mr. and Mrs. H.W. Garvin 
were dinner guests in the John­
nie Wheeler home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dutch Powell 
attended the house warming of 
the Garry Millers at Muleshoe 
Satruday night.

Three Way high school p l a y e d _____ _________________
A>all at Smyer Monday night and there’s nothing wrong with 
With the boys winning and girls Putt,nK the heal on white bread 
losing Monday night tbe Tl.roo
Way Junior high teams played spoiled and you are partly to 
Bledsoe at Bledsoe winning both blame. Now unspoil him! 
games. The Invitational high . . .  * * *
school basketball tournament T » mm£,eive v™,. « ih  »ndf«.i

REGULAR 
2.99 & 3.49

Pillow Coses 
1.24 Pair72"xl04" or 81"x104" 

or bottom fitted sheets

Whi te  mus l in sheets 
mode of 50fto FortreMt 
and 50°o cotton, they 
never need ironing Fa­
mous Dan River quality 
you know you con trust

42"x36" Pillow Cases
Regular

2.59 & 3.29 valuesYou'll like these beautiful new mid-tone colors of Gold, Moss Green, 
Peppermint Pink and Larkspur Blue. They stay smooth, neat and 
wrinkle free no ironing. Dan-Press finish

she Ls working out her students’ 
problems, she can’t help open her 
eyes to your’s.

• *  •
Dear Amy:

We have friends who have a 
son in the Marines stationed in 
VM Nam. We want to send him 
a small gift for Christmas but 
don’t know what would be useful 
or appropriate.

We need suggestions. Got any?
Mr. & Mrs. Sheppard 

Dear Mr. &Mrs.:
Air Mall Stationary,
Religious Artifacts,
Shaving Kit, Soap,
Playing Cards,
Comic Books, 
and . . .
A Subscription to this news­

paper!
• • *

Dear Amy:
My 15 year old son is my 

problem. He is in his first year 
high school and he doesn't like 
it. He plays "hooky" constantly. 
We have talked to him and so has 
everyone else telling him that he 
needs an educat i on.  We have 
bought him books to help him 
and have stopped hlsfriendsfrom 
coming over so that he will have 
more time to study. We won’t let 
him go to shows or go out. He 
says ne will go to school until he 
is 16 and then he’s going to quit.

Perhaps we are too strict with 
him, but my husband and I know 
wha t  it is not to have an edu­
cation and we don’t want to see 
our son drop out. Please let me 
know what to do.

His Mother
Dear Mother:

You cannot force your son to 
study. Nagging and punishing 
will not help either. I suggest you 
enroll him In a vocational school 
where he can learn a trade.

It's too bad that young people 
are not mature enough to foresee 
the future they are making for 
themselves when they lack the 
desire for a good education!

Regular 1.99 and 2.19 valuesA great1 value made expressly for Anthony's
24 X  46

" prBrifS S S  BATH SIZE
72x108 Flot 

or Twin Fitted
81x108 Flat 

or Full Fitted

SIZE WASH CLOTH 42x36 Cases

World Wide sheets, fine quality 100 9c cotton 
mode by a famous mill, exclusively for An­
thony's Don't miss this extra valueFirst quality, thick Jacquard terry towels mode especially tor 

Anthony's. A great towel volue in assorted fashion colors Choose 
your ensemble now at these SPECIAL SAVINGS TO YOU Entire Stock 

King or Queen12" WASH CLOTHS
ted colors
th r if ty  low p rice  1  5  ■

)0 o co tton  te rry  ■ f Q l  |

New soft-sorb Terry
E x tra  soft th irs ty  tea  towels to 
co lo rfu l n o ve lty  p rin ts

Now at sale PricesNo undergarment in the world 
can create a lovely figure from 
a too-heavy body. Not only ls it 
important to stay slim for ap­
pearance’s sake, but also for 
the sake of your health.

Doctors have gone on record 
as saying that a person ls far 
better off being a little under­
weight that over-weight.Unless 
there is a real physical reason 
for excess weight, there ls no 
excuse for allowing oneself to 
become fat.

Some Individuals have a men­
tal complex which causes them 
to overeat.This complex can be 
controlled once itls  understood. 
A sensible diet, coupled with 
the right amount of exercise, 
can well be called the basis of 
good health and good looks.

Unfortunately, there are end­
less fad diets in circulation. 
Don't try any of these.

When you have made up your 
mind that It ls time for you to 
lose some weight, go to your 
family doctor. He will give you 
an examination and prescribe 
the kind of diet you need, and 
one that will be good for you.

Follow your doctor's advice 
as to the amount of weight to 
lose. It is safe for young chlld- 
ren to be put on s diet under a 
doctor's direction. However, s 
child should never be put on s 
diet unless s doctor has exam­
ined him and prescribed the 
diet list.

Tubular Oval Nylon Special Group Dual Control 
E lectric  Blankets

Insulated 
or Regular Queen Size

Please address all letters to:
AMY ADAMS 

c/o THIS NEWSPAPER
For a personal reply enclose a 

stamped, self-addressed envelope.

Special Group
White or Colored

Group 2
A c y r lic  Insulated or

Floral
Blankets

Values to $6 .95

SPORT
Special Purchase Bed

Long or Short Sleeve 

Values to $3 .99

Feather
b L A M i m  Electric 
2 Y r .  Guarantee 
Immeadiate Replacement 
No M ailing  or Waiting

Montgomery Ward’s Catalog 
Sales Agency Will Be Staying
Open Under New Manage­
ment. Full Bed Size 

Single Control or 
Twin Bed Size

Reg.
Feather Pillows $1.39

* Registered T.M. Fiber IndustriesManager
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Editor's note: The Sandhills 
Philosopher on his Johnson 
grass (arm takes a look at 
inflation this week, but it’s 
hard to tell what he sees.
Dear editar:

I had to make another trip 
into town the other day to pick 
up another 5-cent tractor bolt 
now costing 15 cents and since 
I was throwing money around 
recklessly anyway I hauled off 
and bought a newspaper.

In it I ran across an article 
that said the cost of a college 
education is up 68 per cent 
since 1957, and this got me to 
thinking about inflation.

Now you take that 15-cent 
bolt. It’s true it cost three 
times as much as it did 10 or 
12 years ago, but at the same 
time it’s still just as good a 
bolt as the earlier one.

Now with college education, 
will I don’t want to get into 
an argument, uh, I don't want 
to compare bolts and nuts with 
college kids, but are you posi­
tive the product is as good to­

day as it was 12 years ago/ 
Or are they just televising the 
wrong ones?

As 1 understand it, inflation 
hits us in t’«o ways. In one, 
the quality stays the same but 
the price goes up, like in auto- 
mobles. Cars are as good to­
day as they were 12 years ago, 
they just cost a lot more. In 
the other way, the price stays 
the same but the quality comes 
down, like in a nickel candy 
bar. You can still buy a nickel 
candy bar, you just don’t get 
nearly as much candy. Mostly 
wrapper.

But when inflation really 
hurts is when you pay a lot more 
but don't get as much.

Take Congress for example. 
Congress costs over twice what 
it did 12 years ago, but can 
anybody prove...well. I’d better 
not get into that.

It’s an odd thing. Politicians 
are always saying if you raise 
salaries you’ll get a better 
quality of office-holder, but 
what happens? We raise the

salary and the same people 
turn up running for the same 
offices.

There's just one way to whip 
inflation, and if I knew what it 
was I’d say so.

Yours faithfully,

WHO KNOWS!
1. What Is an ocarina?
2' The oceans cover what per 

cent of the world?
3. When did Major Jonathan M. 

Wainwright surrender C or 
regidor to Japan?

4. When was the Red Cross 
organized?

5. During what war was the 
national anthem written?

6. Where is the Yellow Sea?
7. What is the aft of a ship?
8. Where is The Taj Mahal?
9. When was the Department 

of Agriculture created?
10. Whichis the longest river in 

Europe?

Aiswtrs To Who M ows
1. A small, toy wind instrument 

of the whistle type.
2. Seven-tenths.
3 . May 6, 1942.
4. May 21. 1881.
5. The War of 1812.
6. A p o r t i o n  of the Pacific 

Ocean between China and 
Korea.

7. The stem or back end.
8. It is one of the most famous 

tombs in the world located 
in Northern India.

9. By an Act of Congress, May 
15. 1862.

10. The Volga.

Enochs News
By Mrs . J.D.' Boyless
Guests in the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. John Gunter Sr. 
Thursday night were his sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Travis 
from Buffalo Springs Lake, Edd 
Ary met them at the National 
Wildlife Refuge north of Enochs 
and they toured the wildlife 
Refuge.

Rev. and Mrs. Tony McKinney 
and children left Monday for a 
visit with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. T. W. Smith at Dallas. 
They will return home Friday.

R.E. Jones was admitted to 
the Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock, Sunday night 
December 14, his pickup over­
turned near the curve near 
Bill Sowders west of Bula, he 
received a broke neck in the 
mishap.

Walter Layton was honored 
with a birthday dinner at his 
home Sunday. December 15 
was his 80th birthday. Those 
present were his daughters, 
Mrs. Pearl Mize and family of 
Crosbyton, Mrs. Dora Lee 
Ellison and family of Lubbock, 
and their sons, Harold Layton 
and family and J. E. Layton 
and family of Enochs, and other 
grandsons, were Mr. and Mrs. 
Jackie Mize and family of 
Lubbock, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Zane Ellison and son of Mule-

shoe, there were 24 in atten­
dance.

Mrs. C. C. Snitker was ad­
mitted to the West Plains Hos­
pital in Muleshoe, Thursday.

There was a 42 party given 
in honor of Mrs. A. J. Wallace 
at the E.N. McCall home Mon­
day night December 15th. Those 
present were Mrs. H. B. King, 
Mrs. John Gunter, Mrs. C. H. 
Byars, M rs.J. D. Bayless, Mrs. 
Ray Seagler, Mrs. Carl Hall, 
Mrs. Olive Angel, Mrs. L. E. 
Nichols, Mrs. J. W. Layton, 
Mrs. Raymond Austin, Mrs. 
Clyde Price, Mrs. Jessie 
Battles, Mrs. Ada Thomas, 
Mrs. Opal Locker, Mrs. 
Mammle Adams, Mrs. Mildred 
Welch, Mrs. Welma Petree, 
Mrs. A. M. McBee, Mrs. Alma 
Altman, Mr. and Mrs. E. F. 
Campbell, Mrs. McCall, Mrs. 
Wallace and a visitor, Mrs. 
Frank Travis, from Buffalo 
Springs Lake.

Refreshments were candy, 
cookies, cake, punch and coffee.

Mrs. Wallace will be moving 
to Littlefield, her address will 
be 301-E- 20th.

The Enochs G.A.’s and 
sponsors went Christmas 
caroling Wednesday night, then 
they returned to the Church for 
their Christmas party and 
refreshments.

Linda Gilliam of Morton, 
spent Thursday night with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. E.C. 
Gilliam.

p e r r y l s
S E N S A T I O N A L
J A N U A R Y

128 Main 
Muleshoe

507. OFF ON
* Christmas Cards

* Christmas Gift Wraps And Ties
* Christmas Decorations

You’ll Save A Lot If You Buy 
Now For Next Year.

SAVE
CASH!

i s  n o w  in  f u l l  SWINGS What Savings!
"DREAMLAND"

BIRDSEYE
DIAPERS

IRRFGULARS 
OF FINE QUALITY 

DIAPERS

ASSORTED

SPONGES
U T IL IT Y , BOUND. 
BO M -B U U  AND  

BN U IT fB O M O lX

YOUR
CHOICE

r

BIG ASSORTMENT

PLASTIC WARES
P»il» with Pour Spout, Napkin H o ldtn , 3 Qt. 
Mixing Bowla. Rafrigarator Storaga Bowls 
with Covar. Quart S iia  Covarad S trw r* . 
Strainars and 2-Qt. Dacantars

YOUR
CHOICE

VALUES TO 99c
SPECIAL PURCHASE

DRESS
F A B R IC S

HURRY! THIS WILL 
GO OUT QUICK

Spo iti print* and aolid*. 
wamautta print* and solid*, 
bland print* and a graat array 
of othar spring matarial*. 
Coma san for yoursalf how 
great the values are. Wa know 
you'll want several yard* at 
our low sale price. Batter be 
here early!

YARD

8' PLASTIC LACE 
FLORAL

DOILIES
FOR 

JUST

REGULAR 49c

8-INCH BOWLS
lade-ite Bowl 
White Bowl 
Lustre Shell Bowl 
White Bubble Bowl

J r  ̂  dInnerware
(SECONDS)

i  K ) : J 9-INCH PLATES 21c
„  /  i l  10-INCH PLATES 23c

L ' /  COUPF SOUPS 21c
CUPS ............................. 11c
SAUCERS .......................11c

. NAPPIES 23c

HURRY! LIMITED QUANTITIES

SOLID STATE ”8’’

TRANSISTOR

R A D I O

PINT SIZE PLAID 
THERMOS 
BOTTLE

WITH
EARPHONE

AND
BATTERY

CLEAN
SOUND

and
AMPLE

VOLUME

T  OLIVE
ASH TRAYS
HEAVY 

DURABLE 
GLASS

•*c
VALUE

5.95 VALUE
{97

BIG VALUES 
ON

EVERY COUNTER

n o . i i .m

M E T A L
PORTABLE

F I L E
W A LN U T F IN ISH  

W ITH  IN  M X .  
LO C K  K tV .

LOVELY 31-INCH
TABLE LAMPS

REGULAR $595 VALUES

$ 0 9 9• lovely shape* end design* to 
rH oot* from  . fin e  quality 
•NiSOO t'.Bt 04M lasting peauty

w™ThifK rs  us:
O u r quantity l«  limited

Mrs. Bud Thomas, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Guy Sanders 
has been a patient in the Morton 
Memorial Hospital at Morton.

The Sunbeams and their 
sponsors of the Enochs Baptist 
Church had their Christmas 
tree and party Wednesday night 
at the Church fellowship Hall.

Mrs. A.J. Wallace flew to 
Dallas, Monday to spend the 
Christmas Holidays with her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Bob Wallace 
and family.

Mrs. BulahGallant of Odessa, 
has been visiting her daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Barron Graves.

Mrs. Blanche Cash of Mule­
shoe, was a guest In the home 
of her daughter, Mrs. Dean 
Waltrip and family Friday.

Visiting in the home of the 
J.D. Bayless' F riday afternoon 
were her brother and wife Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Coffman of Mor­
ton.

Mrs. Dean Waltrip brought 
her daughter home Friday fron. 
the Morton Memorial Hospital 
where she was a patient the 
past three days with a virus.

Not So Slow
Three men named Jones, all 

in the same line of business, 
opened shops next door to one 
another. The one on the right 
had the name ''Jones*' painted 
in large letters over the door. 
The one on the left immediately 
did the same thing.

The sign-painter then ap­
proached the center Mr. Jones, 
asking him if he would like his 
name painted also.

"N o,”  said the wily o n e .’’I 
want you to paint the word ‘En­
trance,’ over my door.”

Basketball

Froifl Congrtssmon

BOB PRICE
The House of Representatives 

last week approved the smallest 
foreign aid appropriation In his­
tory. The $1.6 billion was more 
than $1 billion less than re ­
quested by the Administration. 
It was adopted by a 200 to 195 
vote. I was among the 195 voting 
against the bill for the reasons 
expressed In my recent news­
letter when the authorization 
bill was passed.

These reasons being the $19 
billion which have been appro­
priated in past years but not 
spent, and secondly, the “ shot­
gun” approach that has been 
taken In giving aid to nearly 
every country on the face of the 
earth.

I will not support foreign aid 
legislation until such time as 
this aid is restricted to nations 
friendly to the United State who 
are willing th help themselves.

EXPORT CONTROL-By a 
vote of 238 to 157 those of us 
opposed to a drastic loosening 
of controls governing export of 
American goods to Communist 
countries were able to return 
the bill to committee.

The major effect of the bill 
would have been to remove 
restrictions on export of high 
quality machinery and tech­
niques to Communist countries. 
This is exactly what the Reds 
want us to do. This would allow 
them to continue to funnel there 
resources into their military 
and space programs by taking 
advantage of machinery and

Schedule
VARSITY AND “ B” TEAM GIRLS’ BASKETBALL

January 2-3 
January 6 
January 9 
January 16 
January 17 
January 20 
January 23 
January 30 
January 31 
February 6 
February 10 
February 13

Jan. 6 Sudan 
Jan. 8-9-10 
Jan. 13 Slaton* 
Jan. 16 Canyon* 
Jan. 20 Tulia* 
Jan. 23

Muleshoe Tournament a Boys 
Littlefield 
Dumas 
Canyon 
Perryton 
Tulia 
Hereford 
Dumas 
Perryton 
Canyon

There 
There 
Here
Here-4;15 p.m.
There
Here
Here
There-4:15 p.m. 
There

Tulia
Hereford

Here
There

VAR’JITY AND B TEAM BOYS
Here 6:30
Hale Center Tournament

A -B

Jan. 27 
Jan. 30 
Feb. 3 
Feb. 6

Slaton*
Canyon*

Feb. 10 Tulia* 

Conference games

There
Here
There
There
Here
There
Here
There
Here

6:30
5:00
6:30

6:30
5:00
6:30

8TH
January 5 
January 12 
January 17 
January 19 
January 22,23,24 
January 26 
January 29,30,31 
February 2 
February 5,6,7 
February 9 
February 12

GRADE A AND B BOYS
Morton
Dtmmitt
Littlefield Tournament 
Morton
Springlake Tournament 
Open
Dimmitt Tournament 
Littlefield
Muleshoe Tournament 
Plainview Estacado 
Littlefield

Here- 5 p.m. 
Here- 5 p.m. 
9th A and B 
There- 5 p.m.

9th A and B 
Here- 5 p.m.
8th and 9th Boys 
Here-5 p.m. 
There-5 p.m.

7TH--8TH--

Jan. 5 or 8 Friona 
Jan. 12 Dimmitt 
Jan. 15 Open 
Jan. 22-23-24 
Jan. 26 Open 
Jan. 29-30-31 
Feb. 2 Open 
Feb. 5 Amherst 
Feb. 9 Open 
Feb. 12 Amherst 
Feb. 16 Friona

^:00
5:00

9TH GIRLS’ BASKETBALL SCHEDULE 
1969-1970 

There 
There
Here or There 
Springlake Tournament 
Here
Dimmitt Tournament 
There 
Here 
There 
There 
Here

5:00

5:00
5:00

7-8-9(che 
7-8-9

8th only

9th only

7-8-9

7-8-9 
7-8-9 (che

UNA SANTA MISI0N
Se Predicara en Espanol 

Por El bien Conocido 
Misionero Franciscano

Padre Julian Rousseau
En Las In Iglesias 
Catolicas De 

Muleshoe 
In English 
Jan. 4-10 
En Espanol 
Jan.11-17

Earth En Espanol Jan. 18-24 
A todos,catoHcos y no- 
catolicos, se extiende una 
invitacion personal por /os 
Padres Franciscanos.

"El que es de Dios oye las 
palabras de Dios.”

_____ _______ (Juan 8:47)

techniques we have perfected- 
in this country.

VOTING RIGHTS—I was A
pleased to be on the prevail-1 ! 
lng side of a vote to amend the 
Voting Rights Acts of 1965.; 
That law banned literacy te s ts : 
for voters in seven Southern 
States but not in the remainder 
of the nation. Because I believe 
this to be discrimination against 
one part of the country, I sup­
ported the Nixon Administra­
tion substitute which extends d 
the coverage of the law to the 
entire country.

BILL INTRODUCTION—I am 
today Introducing a bill to pro­
hibit the use of the names of 
servicemen killed in Vietnam 
without the permission of their 
next of kin.

This bill is intended to stop 
the use of the names of our 
war dead by extremists, Com- t 
munists, and other militant left­
ists In so-called “peace demon­
strations.” Not only does this 
tarnish the names of our fallen 
soldiers, but is an insult to 
the valiant Americans who are 
daily risking their lives to bring 
peace and freedom to the strug­
gling people of South Vietnam.

Anyone, with the exception of 
news media, who used a dead < 
soldier’s name without the writ­
ten permission from the next of 
kin would be subject to a $500 
fine and/or up to one year in 
prison under provisions of the 
biU.

Efforts Boosted 
To Improve
Cotton Grades

Efforts to improve the com­
petitive position of American 
cotton should be continued and 
intensified, says a Texas A&k 
University agricultural econo­
mist.

John G. McHaney, Extension 
economist, In reviewing some 
cotton industry trends for 
periods in the early and late 
1960’s, points out that world­
wide both the production and 
consumption of cotton are on 
the increase.

During the period from 1960- 
62, the United States was pro­
ducing an average of 14.6 mil­
lion bales annually. But, he 
notes, the picture was much 
different for the 1966-68 period. 
American production dropped 
36 percent to an average of 
9.4 million bales annually.

What happened in foreign 
countries? McHaney says pro­
duction for the earlier period 
averaged 31.9 million bales 
compared with 40.3 million 
bales for the later period. 
This is an increase of 26 per­
cent. The implications are 
simple, he says, more com­
petition for American cotton.

He adds that cotton consump­
tion in the world has not de­
clined. For the 1960-62 period, 
world consumption averaged 
45.9 million bales and fron* 
1966-68 it rose by 14 percent 
to 52.4 million bales annually.

And on U.S. exports, he says 
that during the earlier period 
they averaged about 5.1 million 
bales annually but declined by 
22 percent to about 4 million 
bales during the later period.

Foreign free world exports 
have increased from an annual 
average of 9.4 million bales 
to about 11.1 million during the 
later period, an 18 percent 
rise.

Total world exports, includ­
ing communist countries, have 
increased from an annual 
average of 16.3 million bales 
to 17.4 million, up 7 percent.

The worldwide picture, the 
economist says, emphasizes the 
competition between producing 
countries and the need for even 
greater effort on the part of 
the American industry to re ­
gain its former standing.

Gallup poll reports whites 
pessimistic over U.S.

O at Miaite Sports Q iiz
1. Who Is Rico Carty?
2. Name the second-place fin­

ishers in the Ame r i c a n  
League (baseball).

3. What is the money guarantee 
of the World Series winner?

4. What two teams beat the Bal­
timore Colts in their first 
two games this season?

5. Who coaches the Atlanta 
Falcons?

Tkt Aiswtrs
1. Star outfielder of the Atlan­

ta Braves.
2. Detroit (east), Oakland(westk
3. $480,000.
4. The Los Angeles Rams and 

Minnesota Vikings.
5. Norman Van Brocklin.

-Puzzled-
While the art class was set­

ting up a Christmas scene on 
the school lawn, one of the 
boys asked uncertainly. "Where 
shall I put the three wise guys?” 

Father feels about Christmas 
giving the way he does about 
foreign aid, surely there must 
be some way to cut it back 
without killing it entirely.

* - sun, ■ tMl



VALUABLE PRIZES ARE IN STORE 
FOR THE

NEW YEAR’S FIRST ARRIVAL! IN FO R M A TIO N  
MUST BE IN  BY 
JA N U A R Y  15th.

* G iv e  exact time and p lace 
of B irth , Sex , Weight & 
N am e.

*Nam e and address of 
paren ts.

*Baby must be born in 
County.

* l f  baby is born at home, 
Journal must be notified 
w ith in 38 hours.

Whose baby will be the first born 
in Bailey County after the stroke 
of midnight, December 31st? Will 
it be your baby? Read the rules

for entering our event. Winner to 
be announced after January 31st.

THIS EVENT CLOSES JANUARY 31st!

$5 SAVINGS ACCOUNT
For The 

NEW ARRIVAL

Tri-County 
Savings & Loan

From Will Be Received From These Merchants

Bailey County Journal, Sunday, December 2 8 , 1969, Page

1 z2 Case of

BABY
FORMULA

1 L & H Crocery

Hanging

DIAPER STACKER 
TmB IlE B l 13■'-..(■o I?i-M 'is- i

3 Boxes

PAMPERS
Jim's Pay 'n Save

w

Infant’s I
TRAINING CHAIR

r^is j  e n r n r

I Case

BABY FOOD

Piggl? Wiggly

1 $5 SAVINGS ACCOUNT
1 For The 
1 NEW ARRIVAL

1 First National Bank

Playtex
BABY NURSER

New Disposable
BABY BOTTLE

Western Drug

FREE DINNER
For The Parents

Crossroads Cafe

BABY  1
WALKER

From

Western Auto

FREE DINNER
For the Parents

Corral Restaurant

| FIRST PICTURE
1 of the 
1 NEW ARRIVAL

a Morris Nowlin Studio

FREE SHAMPOO 
SET & HAIRCUT

For Mother
Main Street 

Beaulv Salon
J

$5 SAVINGS ACCOUNT
For The

NEW ARRIVAL 

Muleshoe State Bank

? Dozen Little Tot 
Birdseye

DIAPERS
St. (lair's

1 1 Case of
Gerber’s Strained

BABY FOOD
From

White’s Cashway 1 *
FREE

MEXICAN DINNER
J For The Parents
1 El Nuevo Leal’s 
I______Restaurant_____

One Day
DAILY ROOM SERVICE

At No Charge
West Plains 

Memorial Hospital

DIAPER PAIL
From

Perry’s

Infant’s

QUILT
From

The Fair Store

FREE DINNER
1 For the Parents |

| Dinner Bell Cafe

♦
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T A T E  C A P I T A L

H iq h liq h i’S  
S id e liq h tsA N D

bu Venn Sanford

AUSTIN, Tex.—Here’s a hap­
py thought to start the New Yearl 
As an auto owner you’ll have an 
easier time than ever before 
getting your new license tags 
in 1970. This, thanks to a 
revised registration system 
which becomes effective in Jan­
uary.

Texas Highway Department, 
which devised the new system, 
predicts that registrations will 
pass the seven million mark.

For the first time, registra­
tion renewal applications will 
be mailed to every vehicle 
owner in the state. This will 
be done during the month of 
January. However, the regi­
stration period does not begin 
until February 1.

Be on the look out for your 
application. It will arrive in a 
slender envelope marked “ Im­
portant—This is your license 
plate renewal application.”

Don’t throw it iway as junk 
mail. It’s very important!

Your application is a three- 
part form which should not be 
torn apart, hi structions are 
included in the form.

At the start of the registra­
tion period, you may take your 
application and fee to your 
county tax office—or order by 
mail.

It no longer will be neces­
sary to present certificates of 
title or last year’s registration 
receipt when you have the ap­
plication.

Waiting lines at the tax of­
fice of substation should be 
shorter. All the clerks need 
to do is take your money, slap 
a sticker on the application 
form--showing your registra­
tion number and other data— 
and hand over the 1970 plates.

April 1 is the registration 
deadline, but mail applications

want plates sent by mail should 
send the application form to the 
county tax collector along with 
the registration fee (plus $1 
for handling and postage). Be 
sure your correct address is 
shown on the renewal forml

This new system is the re ­
sult of extensive computeriza­
tion of highway department ve­
hicle records. It gives Texas 
one of the most efficient methods 
of registration. And even the 
jolor scheme is new--light blue 

a reflective white back­
ground.

NARCOTISC CHECKS—Stu­
dent involvement and elimina­
tion of “ misinformation” about 
drugs and drugs usage were 
factors discussed at the o r­
ganizational meeting of the in­
terim House Narcotics Investi­
gating Committee.

A final decision on the 
specific areas of investigation 
by the committee will wait until 
Committee Chairman Tom Bass 
of Houston has a chance to meet 
with the Governor, Lieutenant 
Governor and Speaker. Each of 
those three is conducting a study 
of his own.

Bass said that “ Everyone lias 
his ideas about drugs, but very 
few people know, in reality, 
what drugs do what.’- He sug­
gested that other members of 
the committee establish con­
tacts with students in their 
areas.

“ If nothing else,” said Bass, 
“ I hope this Committee will 
separate fact from fiction, and 
wiU deal with the intelligence 
and intellect rather than 
emotion, and will come up with 
recommendations on the basis 
of reasoned research rather 
than popular politics.” If re ­
search indicates that pre­
sent penalities for drug use are 
too stiff, he added, they should 
be reduced or eliminated.

REAPPORTIONMENT OR­
DERED-- Texas’ 21-member 
State Board of Education must 
be reapportioned says the 
three-judge federal court.

However, judges set June 1, 
1971, as the deadline, thus 
averting the need for a special 
legislative session on the is­
sue.

Court concluded that the 
board must avoid discrimina­
tion against urban residents. 
U.S. Supreme Court’s one-man, 
one-vote principle thus was ap­
plied to the state elected body 
with broad governmental state­
wide powers delegated by the 
legislature. Under this order 
the six board members elected 
in 1966 will serve their full 
six-year terms; seven elected 
in fall of 1968 will serve through 
December, 1972; and eight el­
ected in November, 1970, will 
serve only two years.

Atty. Gen. Crawford Martin’s 
office argued unsuccessfully 
that no court can order an ad-

Arts and IndustriesUniversity- 
Mrs. Mary Lewis Kleberg of 
Kingsville, Laurence A. Mc­
Neil of Corpus Christl and 
Hesiquio Rodriquez of Harlin­
gen.

Texas Youth Council—W. 
Forrest Smith of Dallas.

State Board of Control— 
Charles S. Coats Sr. of Hous­
ton (reappointment).

Animal HealthCommission— 
George William Apple of Mc­
Kinney.

State Board of Plumbing Ex­
aminers--Arthur D. Goodman

ministrative body reappor­
tioned.

OIL ALLOWABLE HIKEL 
Railroad Commission has again 
boosted the oil production al­
lowable. It set the figure for 
January at 68 per cent of po­
tential.

This is a raise of 5.3 per 
centage points from the cur­
rent allowable and would permit 
maximum production of 
3,869,658 barrels a day, up 
from the current 3,630,886 top.
But some oilmen say both fig­
ures are considerably higher 
than the actual output anti- of Beaumont, 
cipated. Gulf Coast Waste Disposal

Only 18 or 20 fields in the Authority—Dr. Frank Lamon 
state are capable of producing Jennings of Galveston, 
more oil under an allowable as State Board of Registration 
high as 68 per cent, experts for Public Sruveyors— Kirby 
say. Others are producing at a Hillin of Dallas (reappoint- 
peak of about 58 per cent. Cur- ment), Oliver R. McElyaofDal- 
rent pattern of 62.7 per cent las and Clarence Joseph Mont- 
did not yield as much oil as gomery J r .  of Houston, 
had been expected. Special assistant to governor

APPOINTMENTS — Gov- for conservation and water 
ernor Smith has reappointed development--Tom McFarland 
Tommy V. Smith of Austin as of Hereford.
Commissioner of Labor Upper Colorado River 
Statistics. The two year term Authority -- Jack Douthit of 
expires February 1, 1971. Sterling City, Dale Leddy of 

Other appointments include: San Angelo and L.T. Young- 
Board of Regents, Lamar blood of Bronte (all reappoint-

State College of Technology- 
William Samuel Monroe of Port 
Arthur and John Luther Smith 
of San Augustine; Cecil Ran­
dolph Beeson of Orange was 
reappointed.

Board of Directors, Texas

ments).
OIL SLICK SPREADS— 

Chairman of a senate committee 
on pipeline studies reported an 
oil slick covered a least five 
square miles in Trinity Bay 
near Baytown.
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l MULES and MULETTES
Boys & Girls 1969-1970
B A S K E T B A L L  S C H E D U L E

Muleshoe Independent School District

Varsity and B Team Boys Varsity and B Team Girls’

D ec. 11-12- 3 Tulia Tourney D ec . 11-12-13 Tulia Tourney A  Boys
D ec . 16 Idalou, 5:30 Here and G ir ls
Ja n . 6 Sudan, 6:30 Here D e c . 16 Brownfield There
Ja n . 8-9-10 Hale Center Tou rney D e c . 19 L ittle fie ld Here
Ja n . 13 S laton*, 6:30 There Ja n . 2-3 Muleshoe Tourney A  Boys
Ja n . 16 Canyon*, 5:00 Here Ja n . 6 L ittle fie ld There
Ja n . 20 T u lia * , 6:30 There Ja n . 9 Dumas There
Ja n . 23 There Ja n . 16 Canyon Here
Ja n . 27 Here Ja n . 17 Perry ton, 4:15 Here
Ja n . 30 There Ja n . 20 Tulia There
Feb. 3 S laton*, 6:30 Here J a n . 23 Hereford Here
Feb . 6 Canyon*, 5:00 There Ja n . 30 Dumas Here
Feb. 10 T u lia * , 6:30 Here Ja n . 31 Perryton, 4:15 There

*Conference games Feb . 6 Canyon There
Feb. 10 Tulia Here
Feb. 13 Hereford There

8th and 9th A and B Boys 8th and 9th Girls’

D ec. 11-12-13 Friona Tourney
D ec. 15 Dimmitt, 5:00 There
Ja n . 5 Morton, 5:00 Here
Ja n . 12 Dimmitt, 5:00 Here
Ja n . 17 Little fie ld  Tourney 9th A & B
Ja n . 19 Morton, 5:00 There
Ja n . 22-23-24 Springlake Tourney
Ja n . 26 Open
Ja n . 29-30-31 Dimmitt Tourney 9th A & B
Feb. 2 L itt le fie ld , 5:00 Here
Feb. 5-6-7 Muleshoe Tourney 8th & 9th
Feb. 9 P lainview  Estacado,

5:00 Here
Feb. 12 L itt le fie ld , 5 :00 ' There

Friona Tourney 8th O n ly
15 Dim m itt, 5 :0 0 , 8-9  Here

5 or 8 Friona, 5 :0 0 , 8-9  There
12 Dim m itt, 5 :0 0 , 8-9  There
15 O p en , Here or There
22-23-24 Springlake Tourney 8th O n ly
26 Open Here
29-30--31 Dimmitt Tourney 9th O n ly
2 Open There
5 Amherst, 5 :0 0 , 8-9 Here
9 Open There
12 Amherst, 5 :0 0 , 8-9 There
16 Friona , 5 :0 0 , 8-9 Here

State agnecies, reported Sen. 
D. Roy Harrington of Port 
Authur, had no comprehensive 
map of pipelines in submerged 
lands which makes it difficult 
to find the company at fault. 
Texas Water Quality Board said 
that unless it can find the com­
pany at fault there are no funds 
available for the state to clean 
up the pollution.

Governor Smith dispatched a 
four-man team to make an on- 
the-spot Investigation of the oil 
slick. He asked that a detailed 
report be made by him. As­
signed to the investigating team 
were John Shanahan J r ., state- 
local relations division of the 
governor’s office; Jim Herring, 
hearing examiner for Texas 
Railroad Commission; Terry 
Leary, coordinator of coastal 
fisheries for Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department, and Joe 
Teller, deputy director of Texas 
Water Quality Board.
HANDICAPPED — Texas In­

ternational Airlines, the old 
Trans Texas, will fly 70 to 80 
handicapped persons to Austin 
from the Texas Rehabilitation 
and Research Institute in Hous­
ton to take part in Sen. Chris 
Cole’s governor for a day cele­
bration on January 10.

The Harris County senator, 
who was blinded while a Marine 
in World War II, said the theme 
of his celebration will be the 
accomplishments and potential 
of the state’s handicapped per­
sons.

Over 65 exhibits--ranging 
from a special Medi-car forth( 
handicapped to amputees dem­
onstrating the use of artificial 
limbs—will be displayed around 
the capitol.

GOING, GOING, GONE — 
Blake Moore of Paris, Texas,

. is a pretty good salesman. In 
fact, he peddled $1,763,500

• worth of goods just recently. 
Moore is the auctioneer for 
the University of Texas mineral 
lease sales under the General 
Land Office.

Sale involved 37,914 acres of 
land in far West Texas—in An­
drews, Gaines, Ward, Winkler, 
Terrell, Pecos, Reagan, Huds­
peth and Crockett counties. 
Lease sales brought an average 
price of $45.58 an acre.

SHORT SNORTS — District 
Judge David Brown of Sherman 
announced he is a “probable” 
candidate for attorney general 
against incumbent Crawford 
Martin.

Governor Smith announced 
that the North Central Texas 
Council to Governments will 
receive a $51,619 U.S. Depart­
ment of Health, Education and 
Welfare grant for its areawide 
health planning program.

Texas Employment Commis­
sion reports the harvesting of 
vegetables and fruits, mostly 
in the Lower Rio Grande Val­
ley and the Rio Grande Plains, 
provided over 4,000 more farn. 
job openings during November 
than in October while non-farm 
placements dipped almost 6,000 
from October.

Agriculture Commissioner 
John C. White has announced 
that he will be a candidate 
for reelection.

It is estimated by the Texas 
Safety Association that 1969 
will be the first year in the

. State’s History when more than 
250,000 persons will be killed

■ and injured on Texas roads.
Texas Professional Cor-

■ poration Act does not apply to 
corporations organized for the 
purpose of performing profes-

. sional engineering services, 
says Attorney General Martin.

- Western State Bank at Mid­
land is seeking a state charter.

'  More than 400 Texas cities 
which levy one per cent local 
option municipal sales taxes

. received over $29.4 million 
from this source for the quar-

- ter, Comptroller Robert S. 
Calvert reports.

■ Texas Liquor Control Board 
reports more than $50.4 mil­
lion were paid in alcoholic bev-

. erage excise taxes in Texas 
last fiscal year-beer accounted

» for $29.4 million; distilled 
spirits nearly $19 million; wine,

■ $1.4 million, and malt liquor, 
$553,511.

Obituaries
Arthur Reeves

SPO N SO RED BY THE FO LLO W IN G  "BASKETBA LL SUPPORTERS" W HO URG E Y O U  TO ATTEN D  THE G A M ES :

Cobb's
+  Texas Sesame

First National Bank 

Slleshoe Co-op Gins

Luck Laundrette 

>e Publishing Co.

uevo Restaurant

Swap Shop

King Grain Co.
I)r. B.R. Putman  
Gordon Wilson Appl.

Dolly Cup Drive In

Eddie's Food Market

Morris Douglass Imp.

Crow Chevrolet 

First Street Conoco

Arthur Reeves, 65, of Crane 
died suddenly of a heart a t­
tack early Wednesday morning.

Funeral services were held 
Friday at 3:00 p.m. in Rix 
Chapel, Odessa, with burial in 
Memorial Park at Odessa.

Survivors include his wife 
Ella; three daughters, Mrs. Ray 
Harvell, Odessa, Mrs. Jerry  
Ray and Miss Linda Reeves, 
both of Grand Prairie; two 
sons, Arthur Paul, J r . of Dal­
las and Bobby of McAllen; 16 
grandchildren and seven great 
grandchildren; two sisters, 
Mrs. Minnie Moore of Mule- 
shoe and Mrs. Mary Pruitt of 
Gainesville.

Reeves was born at Marys­
ville, Cook County, Texas Feb­
ruary 28, 1904. He was a mem­
ber of the United Methodist 
Church and Masonic Lodge. He 
was a retired oilfield worker, 
having worked 40 years, 65 
days for the same company at 
the time of his retirement.

Attending the memorial se r­
vices with Mrs. Moore w p ™  

her daugher and son-in-law 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Stinson, 
her daughter and granddaugh­
ter, Mrs. Murry Simmons and 
Mona.

Sudan News
By Evolyn M. Scott

Mrs. MattNixJr. was hostess 
for an annual Christmas Bridge 
Club party when a turkey and 
dressing with trimmings high­
lighted the luncheon meeting and 
gifts were exchanged by mem­
bers present.

Mrs. R.E. Scott placed high 
in scoring with Mrs. Glenn 
Gatewood, second.

Other members present were 
Mrs. Ves Patterson, Mrs. Cleo 
Whitmire, Mrs. Hershell Olds, 
Mrs. Clovis Bridwell, Mrs. J.B. 
Harper.

College students home for the 
holidays include Brenda Drake, 
Blake Wallace, Mike and Kathy 
Fisher, Judy West, and Sherry 
Whiteaker.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Graves 
and family of Calif, have been 
visiting in the home of his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J.A. Graves.

Mr. and Mrsl Earl Ware of 
Sunray visited during the week­
end in the home of their daugh­
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Amos.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Rone 
hosted the annual Brewster 
family reunion Sunday.

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Ethel Jackson, 60, were held 
recently in Vashti, Texas. Mrs. 
Jackson was a sister to J.W. 
New, Sudan area farmer.

Visiting Sunday in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Glen Card- 
well were Mr. and Mrs. R.C. 
Carter of Muleshoe.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Heffington and son, Brad, were 
guests Christmas day in the 
home of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R.E. Scott and Randy.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Curry 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Hum­
phreys spent the holidays with 
their children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Randy Humphreys and son in 
Fort Worth.

Debbie Fields, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Louis Fields, 
installed officers of the Sudan 
4-H Club for the coming year 
at a recent meeting.

Installed were Helen Black, 
president; Tracey Bowling, vice 
president; Connie Ham, secre­
tary; Kevin May, treasurer; 
Barbara Black, reporter.

During the meeting gifts were 
also exchanged and refresh­
ments served to approximately 
30 persons attending.

Mr. and Mrs. R.E. Scott and 
Randy visited Wednesday with 
her mother, Mrs. Clara Par­
rott, who is confined to the 
Hospitality House in Littlefield.

The Sudan Hornet band, under 
the direction of Tommy Evins, 
presented a Christmas con­
cert Wednesday at the school 
assembly.

Following the concert, an­
nouncements were made by 
Kenneth Noles, high school 
principal and W.E. Hancock, 
superintendent. Awards were 
made by Coaches Gray and Cain 
to football players in grades 
seven through 12.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Shafer and 
T h o u  h a s  o rd a im -d , w hat is man children of Abilene; Mrs. Leona

Tollett of Amherst; Dennis and 
W/ayne Tollett of Rogers, New 
Mexico were weekend guests 
in the Marvin Tollett Home.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Curry a t­
tended a Christmas party Sun­
day at the home of his s is ­
ter-in-law. Mrs. Joe Curry in

Democratic convention 
form group split.

BIBLE VERSE

re-

’ * h e n
i .  the

I c o n s id e r  T h y  h c a v -  
w o rk  o f T h y  f in g e rs , 

moon and the s t a r s ,  w h ich

th a t T h o u  art m in d fu l o f  h im ? and 
the so n  o f m an , that Thou v is i t -  
e th  h im ? ”

1. Can you locate this quota­
tion in the Bible’

2. Who is the author of it’
3. Have you an idea of the an­

swer to these questions’
4. Where 

found’
can the answer be Lubbock.

Custom Farm Service *  Aaswirs To Bible Verse
*

Whitt, Watts & Rempe  ^
J rBailey County Electric Co-op Assn.  ̂

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ * ★ ★ ★

1. Psalm 8:3-4
2. David, great king of the Jews, 

who died about 1016 B.C., 
according to Josephus, Jew­
ish historian.

3. and 4. Found in the verses 
following the quotation.

JERRIS LEONARD

An Assistant Attorney C 
eral said: “ If the Court * 
to order instant intergra 
nothing would change. Soi 
one would have to enforce 
order.”
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W A N T  A O WORK WONDERS

WART ADS PH. 2 72 -4 5 3 4
CLASSIFIED RATES

OPEN RATES
First insertion , per word- 7?
Second and additional insertions - 5?

NATIONAL RATES 
First insertion per word- 9$
Second and additional insertion- 6?

Minimum charge- 75?
Card of Thanks - $1.50 Double rate for blind ads 

Classified Display.- 95? per col inch
$1.05 col. inch for reverses

DEADLINE FOR INSERTION
Thursday’s Muleshoe Journal - Noon Tuesday 
Sunday’s Bailey County Journal - Noon Friday
The Journals reserve the right to classify, revise 
or reject any classified ad.

Check advertisement and report any error immediately 
Journals are not responsible for error after ad has a l­
ready run once.

1967 Model Zenith 23” Color 
TV. $329.95 New Picture tube 
One-year parts warranty. 90 
days on labor. Gordon Wilson 
Appliance. 202 Main, Mule- 
shoe.
12-48t-tfc

It’s inexpensive to clean and 
upholstery with BLUE LUSTRE 
Rent electric shampooer $1. 
Perry’s 128 Main.
12-50t-ltc

Lost bright carpet colors... re ­
store them with BLUE LUSTRE. 
Rent electric shampooer $1. 
Higginbotham - Bartlett 215 
Main.
12-50t-ltc

15. MISCELLANEOUS
^ W W V W \^ » /W W N ^ ,

I. m l ,  >■ No. 

1217 At 4AM
Masonic 

Lodge
m ete th** •terund 

T uesrta \ o f etc h month 
practice night each Thursday

Glen Lull W M 
Flbeo Nowell , Sec.

». REAL ESTATEfQR SALE,

Joycoos

FOR RENT: Furnished apart­
ments large or small. Trailor 
space. Brisco Apartments. 
Phone 3465 

-34t-tfc
Two Bedroom brick 11/2 bath. 
Fenced with patio and well. 
Phone. 272-4775 
8-43t-tfc

FOR SALE: 6 cemetary lots. 
Bailey County Memorial Park. 
Lots 1-2-5-6-7 & 8 In Block 
92, Garden 2.

Compact Farfrsia combo or­
gan-22 pedals 36 keys 

Call Ralph Broyles ^nona, 247- 
3419.
15-51s-10tc

i rro ry

fey. U  Nn

C u r t i i  W a l k e r , Prfe *.

Meloskoo
Oddfellows

uM met
rturm*7 7:» P-®*

Z e d  llo b in io n , N o b le  G ra n d

H obs

Cleb

WiWinfey. 11  »■—
fe l lo w sh ip  hall. n M fe n e  c t u e t  

fc»ek Johruon , P rw iden )

COTTON ALLOTMENT: For 
Sale in Parmer County. 20-6 
acres. 615 lbs. 17 1/2? per 
lb. John Clark phone 272-3848. 
8-51s-3tc

FOR SALE: Cotton alltoment 
66.7 acres. Yield 390 lbs. price 
26? per lb. Call Adolph Wit- 
tner 927-3186.
8-52t-2tp

KREBBS REAL ESTATE 
25 years in Bailey County 
210 South 1st.
8-46s-tfc _______

VFW

FOR SALE: Sw 1/4 Sec. 75, 
3 1/2 miles south Stegall, all 
cultivation, allotments 46.8A 
connton, 98A grain, Vernon Ad­
cock, Box 359, Lamesa, Texas. 
8-45s-tfc

FOR SALE; Carload steel hog 
panels 34” X 16’ Galvanized 
McCort Construction Co. A- 
cross from Gibson's. _ Plain- 
view, Texas.
8-43s-19tc

16. LIVESTOCK

NEED, LIGHT CALVES? 
Stocker cows, feeders? Call 
Ted Haberer 257-2113 Earth, 
Texas. 
l-37t-tfc

Waltwr A . Mo«IUr 
Post • 85 70

8:30 p.tn.
2od A 4th Moodaya

Community Room Muleshoe State Bank 

Jimmie Crawford, Commander

rOR SALE: Nice 3 bedroom 
bouse. See at 1412 W. Ave. C. 
8-49s-tfc

meets every 

Tuesdiy at 12 00 

FELLOWSHIP HALL 

Methodist Church

Muleshoe Rotary Cleb
f  T .  F o r d , Praddfenr

HAVE some good F.H.A. and 
V.A. listings. Also some 
good buys on dwellings and 
residential and business lots. 
We need your listings. 
Lee Pool and W.E. Goforth, 
POOL REAL ESTATE Co. 
116 East Ave. C. Call 272- 
4761.
8-19s-stfc

Political
Announcements

The following candidates 
have authorized the Journal 
to announce their candida­
cies for the offices indica­
ted, subject to the action 
of the Democratic and Re­
publican Primaries in May.

County Treasurer 
Edith Wilt

B u i a News
By M rs. John Blackman

The Bula Methodist Church 
was the setting for the com­
munity Christmas tree Tues- 

evening December 22. The 
program opened by the pastor 
Rev. Day giving a welcome 
and leading in prayer. Mrs. 
Clyde Hogue read a story “ The 
Unexpected Guest” . Edward 
Clawson read the Christmas 
story as told by the writer Luke. 
Rev. Eddie Howard and Mrs. 
Larry McCain sang a special 

What Child Is This” with Mar- 
gret Richardson at the piano 
and Barbara Black accompany­
ing on her flute. The program 
concluded by the choir, made 
up of young people singing"Sil- 
ver Bells” and "Here comes 
Santa Claus” . Santa made his 
appearance bringing gifts to 
all the little folks and bags of 
fruit and candy to all present.

Mr. and Mrs. C.L. Cannon 
and Mrs. V.C. Weaver were 
among the old friends of the 
John Johnsons’ who attended 
the golden wedding observance 
Sunday that was hosted by the 
Johnson’s children and held in 
the YL Methodist church. Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnson lived in the 
Bula community for several 
years befored moving to Mule 
shoe.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bogard 
received word Tuesday morning 
that they had a new grandson. 
Thomas Ranee Roberts, born 
Tuesday morning at 9:45 in a 
Houston hospital to Mr. and 
Mrs. Delbert Roberts. He 
weighed seven pounds and thir­
teen ounces.

Mrs. Roberts will be remem­
bered here as Opal Bogard. 
Other grandparents are Mrs. 
W.M. Roberts of McCamey.

Frank Claunch was able to 
come home from the Medical 
Arts Hospital Sunday after a 
stay of several weeks.

Howard Vernon Wright, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Wright 
left Monday morning for Lub­
bock where he will be sent to 
Albuquerque for induction into 
the Navy.

Recent guests in the W.C. 
Burns home were friends Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam York of Fort 
Worth.

—-1 % -y w v M v x n ^
9. AUTOMOBILES FOR SALE

1. PERSONALS

Kirby
Sales & Service

New Dealer 
Carolyn Duncan 

220 W. 10th Pho, 4182

PICKUP

LADD PONTIAC
12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

‘̂ ^ J e l p ^VANtSd^ ^ ^  To party with good credit, re ­
possessed 1968 model Singer 
Sewing Machine. 5 payments at 
$5 .56. Will discount for cash. 
Write Lubbock Sewing Center, 
1114 19th St., Lubbock, Texas 
79401, P02-3126.
12-51t-tfc

Beautician needed guaranteed 
salary. Call 272-3632. Mule­
shoe Beauty Salon.
3-43s-tfc

WANTED; Hair stylist Main 
Street Beauty Shop. Phone 272- 
3448.
3- 35s-tfc

4. HOUSES FOR RENT

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom house, 
1908 W. Ave. B. $35 Der month.
4 -  51t-4tc

5. APTS. FOR RENT

FOR RENT: Furnished apart­
ments. Layne apartments 524 
South 1st.
5-26s-tfc

,N 4V W N /W W V S<W V W V <
6. ROOMS FOR RENT

FOR RENT: 
West 2nd 
6-34s-tfc

bedrooms 410

Bedroom for Pent: 807 W. 7th 
Phone 4166 or 4903 
6-49t-tfr

7. WANTED TO RENT

WANTED: Irrigation land to 
rent or lease. Contact Dee 
Brown, Route 3, Muleshoe, Tex­
as. Phone Lazbuddie exchange 
965-2356.
7-51s-4tp

CARPET: Nylon, Acrylic,
Polyester, Shag and loop-Com- 
mercial- residence. $5.12 - 
$7.30 sq. yard. Installed 293- 
5554, Plainview, Texas. 
12-51t-4tp

1969 Model Design-O-Matic 
Sewing Machine in optional 8- 
drawer, Early American cabi­
net with chair. Button holes, 
fancy patterns, etc. Half paid 
out, Free Home Demonstration. 
20 years parts and service 
guarantee. Write Lubbock Sew­
ing Center, 1114 19th St., Lub­
bock, Texas. 79401, P02-3126. 
12-51t-tfc

DO YOU HAVE roaches, ants, 
silver fish or any household 
pests? We specialize in termite 
control. For free inspection 
Call Ronnie Capps collect 
763-3154, Clovis, New Mexico. 
Mohawk Pest Control Service. 
l-52s-tfc

FOR SALE: Used gas wall fur­
nace, one floor furnace, bath­
room wall mounted heater and 
one K.C. door. C.L. Taylor. 
614 Austin phone 272-3196. 
12-49s-8tc

FOR SALE: Used Recllner 
chair, phone 272-3826. 
12-51s-ltc

LEGAL NOTICE

bock; Mr. Eldrid Mize, and son 
Sterling, Crosbyton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Zane Ellison of Muleshoe; 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Ellison and 
family of Crosbyton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Randal Ellison of Abilene. 
Also Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Lay- 
ton and boys and Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Layton and children of 
Enochs.

Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Wright 
left Monday to spend the Christ­
mas holidays with their son Bill 
and family at Idaho Falls, 
Idaho.

Among the college students 
home for the holidays are Juana 
Young, Tech; Barbara Clawson, 
and Elaine Hall, South Plains 
Junior College; Mr. and Mrs. 
Chub Newton, and Gordon Mc­
Daniels, A&M College; Mike 
Richardson, South Plains; Cyn­
thia and Sherry Withrow, Abi­
lene Christian College.

All the children of the Toni 
Bogards were present for a 
get-together on Saturday and 
Sunday except Mr. and Mrs. 
Delbert Roberts. They were 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Gaston, 
Bo and Beckey of Fort Worth; 
Mr. and Mrs. Jake Bogard and 
children Brad and Shell 
of Charlie; Dusty Bogard of 
Littlefield and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Kennison and girls Kim 
and Dusty of Olton.

Mr. and Mrs. John Hubbard 
left Wednesday to spent Christ­
mas with their daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Barney 
Oldfield of Grants, N.M 

Mr. and Mrs. V.C. Weaver 
received word from their 
granddaughter Miss Barbara 
Huffman, secretary toaColonel 
in the air force, stationed at 
Frankfurt, Germany, that she 
along with friends would spend 
the holidays skiing in Austria. 
Thanksgiving they skied in 
Switzerland.

Mrs. and Mrs. Leon Jones 
from Arizonia arrived Satur­
day for a stav of several days 
visiting with his father at the 
Methodist Hospital, Lubbock 
and also doing some visiting 
with other relatives and friends.

Young people from the Church 
of Christ went to several homes 
Tuesday evening, singing 
Christmas carols and also pre­
senting bags of Christmas 
goodies. Later they met at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Nolan 
Harlan and enjoyed a hot dog 
supper.

NOTICE OF EXECUTION ANL 
SALE

By virtue of an execution 
issued out of the District Court 
of Bailey County, Texas, on a 
judgment rendered in said Court 
upon the 16th day of May, A.D. 
1966, in favor of Muleshoe State 
Bank against the said Ray E, 
Santos, in the cause of Mule­
shoe State Bank vs John J . 
Mock, et al. No. 2877, upon the 
docket of said Court, I did upon 
the 5th day of December, A.D.
1969, at 12:00 o’clock p.m., 
levy upon the following de­
scribed real property and land 
situated in Bailey County, State 
of Texas, as the property of 
said Ray E. Santos, to wit:

All of the Southwest quarter 
(SW1/4) of Section 75, Block 
” Y,”  W.D. & F.W. Johnson 
Subdivision No. 2, Bailey 
County, Texas, lying North 
and East of the p 1 N T  
Railway Co. right-of-way, 
containing 114 acres of land; 
and,
All of the North half of the 
Northwest quarter (Nl/2 
NW 1/4) of Section 75, Block 
"Y ,” W.D. &F.W. Johnson 
Subdivision No. 2, of Bailey 
County, Texas, containing 80 
acres of land,

on the 6th day of January, A.D.
1970, being the first Tuesday of 
said month, between the hours 
of 10 a.m. and 4 p.m., on said 
day, at the courthouse door of 
said county, I will offer for sale 
and sell at public auction, for 
cash, all of the right, title and 
interest of the said Ray E.
Santos and to said lands.

Dated at Muleshoe, Texas, 
this the 5th day of December, 
A.D. 1969.

Dee Clements 
Sheriff of Bailey County Texas 
49s-3stc

Conscientious citizen: 
couldn’t serve as a Juror-Judge. 
One look at that fellow con­
vinces me he’s guilty.”
Judge: "Quiet! That’s the dis­
trict attorney. ”

Visiting Sunday afternoon in 
the John Blackman home were 
Mr. and Mrs. R.L. Blackman 
and Mrs. W.T. Carter of Lov- 
ington and Mrs. Nettie Black­
man of the Muleshoe Nursing 
Home.

R.E. Jones was involved in a 
one car accident Sunday night 
December 14, he was taken to 
the Littlefield Hospital, then 
later transferred to the Metho­
dist Hospital, Lubbock. He r e -1 
ceived a severe neck injury 
and is recovering as well as 
can but has several weeks of 
hospital care ahead of him.

Christmas day dinner guests 
in the Larry McCain home were 
Mr. and Mrs. W.H. Parks of 
Tucson, Arizonia; Mr. and Mrs. 
D.C. Parks of Quanah; Mrs. 
Audry McCain, Littlefield; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Childres of 
Abernathey. Also Mr. and Mrs. 
W.C. Burns and Mr. and Mrs 
Gaylon Burns of Bula.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Aus­
tin spent Christmas day with 
her mother Mrs. Moore at 
Clovis. Over the weekend they 
had their children Mr. and Mrs 
Orphas Tate and sons fron 
Mobeetie and Mr. and Mrs 
J.R Austin and boys of Enochs

Mrs. E.W. Black has recently 
returned home from a stay ol! 
several months with her daugh 
ter and family in Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Mc­
Daniel and small son Timothy 
arrived Saturday night fron 
College Station to spend the 
Christmas holidays with their 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Elwood 
Autry and Mr. and Mrs. Marion 
McDaniel.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tharp and 
girls are spending the holidays 
in Paris with her mother and 
other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Layton had 
their Christmas dinner on Wed 
nesday 24. To enjoy the Christ 
mas tree and bountiful dinner 
were Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Lay 
ton of Seattle, Washington; Mr 
and Mrs. Earnest Ellison, Lub-

COW  POKES B y  Ace Reid

Cot,***1 **!*/£
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/0 - / S "

\

"Pin, would you git back and hold this calf . . .  besides 
you're standin on my piggin string!"

Calve Heifers At Two Years Says Specialist
Texas stockmen may profit 

from suggestions by a Texas 
A & M University animal re­
production specialist.

John Beverly, Extension 
specialist, said if certain c ri­
teria are met, heifers can be 
bred to calve at 2 years of age 
without running the risk of their 
falling to calve as 3-year-olds.

The criteria listed by Bev­
erly includes: (1) growing the 
heifers so they will gain about 
one and a quarter pounds per 
day; (2) avoid pushing heifers 
to a point of becoming fat; 
(3) heifers must weight 600 
pounds when they are bred, 
and (4) the heifers need to be 
bred to calve 30 - 60 days

before the regular cow herd 
completes calving.

"The heifers must get their 
growth before they are bred 
in order for them to breed 
right back for their second 
calf,”  Beverly said. "Other­
wise, there is a big risk of 
their missing the second calf 
in order to satisfy the body 
requirements for growth.”

The reason for breeding 
heifers to calve 30 - 60 days 
ahead of the regular cow herd 
goes back to the growth factor.

"A heifer with a first calf 
has four requirements for the 
feed consumed - body mainten­
ance, milk production, growth, 
and reproduction. If any of

these have to be sacrificed, re ­
production is the first to go. 
The mature cow does not have 
the growth requirement, so the 
extra 30 - 60 days allow some 
time for growing without sac­
rificing reproduction. This in­
sures the second calf heifers 
to calve on time with the re ­
mainder of the herd,” Beverly 
said.

C h a n c e s  a re  B e tte r
"Son, if you continue to study 

hard and be industrious it’s 
within the realm of possibility 
that your face will some day ap­
pear on a hundred dollar b ill.”

"Thanks, Dad, but I'd prefer 
Jto have my hands on one.”

The Lonely Hear!

WATCH FOR
THE

JANUARY
CLEARANCE

SALES
By The

MULESHOE MERCHANTS
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In The
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CHUCK
ROAST ROASR

Blade 
( ut

IJ S D A 
Choice

4*.

B o n e le ss  W aste  Free  U S D A C ho ice  Beef

CHUCK ROAST Pound
B o n e le ss  W aste  F ree  U S D A C h o ice  B eef

TOP ROUND STEAK Pound
B o n e le ss  W aste  F ree  U S D  A C h o ice  Beef

ROUND ROAST Bottom
Bro i o P a r  F ry  U S  D A C ho ice  B e e f

EYE OF ROUND STEAK

9 5 c 1
* J 4 9

Serve

I 29
Pound

Pound
JJ89

Pound
Blackeyed Peas

SALT JOWLS
Boneless Waste Free, U.S.D.A. Choice Beef

ARM ROAST
Stew or Boil for Soup, U.S.D.A. Choice Beef

PLATE BOIL

Pound <

Pound

Pound

Center cut 
Chuck

u . s . n  A 
Choice 
Beef

Pound
Shoulder Cuts, U.S.D.A. Choice Beef

SWISS ARM STEAK
Braise or Barbecue, U.S.D.A. Choice Beef

SHORT RIBS
Larded and Tied, U.S.D.A. Choice Beef

PRIME RIB ROAST

Pound 8 9 c
Pound

Pound

Pound

B o n e le ss . W aste  F ree . U S  D A C h o ice  Beet

PIKE’S PEAK ROAST
W isc o n s in  B ran d

SAUERKRAUT „ 49‘
C h o ice  B la d e  C u t, U .S .D .A  C h o ice  Beef

FAMILY STYLE STEAK Pound 69'
S h o u ld er C u ts . U .S .D .A  C h o ice  B eef

ARM ROAST Pounrt 79'

A llsw eet 3c O ff Labe

MARGARINE
H a rve s t  P ride  F la k y

BISCUITS
Pillsbur>

SNOWFLAKE ROLLS 8 O unce  C a n  33'

1 Pound P ackag e

6-Count C a n  1 0 ' PORK CHOPS Full lA Pork Loin 
Lean Northern

Pork pound

S u n sh in e , V ien n a  F in gers

COOKIES
N ab isco , R itz

CRACKERS
K ee b le r , A sso rted

SNACK CRACKERS 10-Ounce B o xe s 47'

1 2 '/. O unce  P a cka g e  43' 
16-Ounce B o xes 47'

t e l ; s 1r i i | A 1-  PiGGLY 
r WiGGLY

Chicken of the Sea

CHUNK TUNA

DOUBLE S&H 
GREEN STAMPS 

WEDNESDAY
WITH $2.50 
PURCHASE 
OR MORE

No. l/2 Can

potatoC H IP S
Farmer Jones

Regular or 
Dip Style Regular 

59c Bag
Frito  B rand

BEAN DIP 10 O unce  C an

Ranch Style

BLACKEYE PEAS
King Size, Plus Deposit

COKES or 7-UP
Pure Vegetable Shortening

CRISCO
Gold Medal

FLOUR
Gerber’s

BABY FOOD
Cloverlake , Assorted Flavors

ICE CREAM

46 0unce Can

No. 300 Can

6-Bottle Carton

3-Pound Can

3 5 e 
1 0 '  

3 9 c 
7 9 c

5-Pound Bag 5 5 c
j 4 3/i'Ounce 2 9 c 

Vi-Gallon 69*

FRESH 
EGG NOG

59*Quart Carton
Bo rden 's

EGG NOG

GINGER
ALE

Rite Good and
Sparklingwater

28-Ounce 
Throw­
away 

Bottles2 29*
C an ad a  D ry

BEVERAGES 28 O unce B o ttle

CRANBERRY
JUICE

Ocean Spray

Big 48-Ounce 
Bottle

O cean  S p ra y

CRANBERRY JUICE
75<

APPLE
CIDER

White House

Vi-Gallon 59*
W hite  H ouse

APPLE CIDER

CHEESE
SPREADS

Kraft’s 
Pimento. 
Pineapple 
or Olive 
Pimento

CHEEZ WHIZ 8-O unce J a r

fym p a A i! U i th  J o w , J o w  *?/

FRUIT PIES
Morton’s

Apple, Peach 
or Cherry

20-Ounce Pie
Silverdale

CUT CORN
tropic Fresh

DRINK MIXES
Patio

COCKTAIL TACOS

29*
10-Ounce Package 2 2 c

29c
24-Count # Q .  
Package O 7*-

6-Ounce Can

DIP N CHIP
's Assorted 

Flavors

8-Ounce
Cartons

B e l l s

SOUR CREAM

tom ftoM  'J U u  Eu w jd a jj J o w , J o w  'J a u u !

libbey GLASSES
DRINKING

Satin or Windsor 
All Sizes and Colors

Value to 29c Each

5
8 O unce  C a rto n

These Values Good December 2 9 ,3 0 , & 31 1969 
in Muleshoe, Texas

GojJM -Jwk 'JjwduCt l/UM T W v  Wm Im!

Permanently Bonds All Materials. Individual Applications

EPOXY GLUE rSUTwS  79c
Ray-O-Vac, Size C or D

BATTERIES " X " 25' 2 39c
Ray-O-Vac. Alkaline, Values to 95c Retail, Size C or D
n  A T T C D I C C  Lasts 10 Times Longer r% $ |3 9  
D H  I I C K I C d  Than Regular Batteries Z  for •

We Reserve the Right to Limit Quantities

GRAPEFRUIT 
ORANGES

TEXAS 
Ruby Red

Pound

CLOSED

NEW YEAR’S

NAVEL
California

Sweet
Pound

Yellow, U. S. No. 1 Mild

ONIONS
California Poly Bag

CELERY HEARTS

California, Clip Top

. 1 5 '  TURNIPS
Wmesap, Washington Extra Fancy

5 9 ' APPLES

;>v-A
»" * -f ■< ..«K / « H f  . M ^


