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3 School Posts 
To Be Filled

Creighton Announces
Senator Tom Creighton of 

Mineral Wells has today an­
nounced his intentions to seek 
re - election from the 22nd 
Senatorial District to the Texas 
Senate for the term com­
mencing January 1973 
Creighton was first elected to 
the Senate in I960 and is now
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YOUNG FOLKS, better 
watch out! Your parents were 
enjoying your music Tuesday 
night They went to hear the 
Dallas Symphony Orchestra at 
Cisco Junior College's Fine 
Arts Auditorium, and got a 
double bonus in variety, with 
a generous helping of the 
famous "Dallasound"

The first section being pretty 
much what was anticipated, 
and done up in great style 
Rimsky • Korsakov’s Capriccio 
Kspagnol is a perfect opener 
- rousing, and a showpiece for 
just about every segment of the 
fine, well balanced orchestra 
Followed by the less familiar 
Alborado del Gracioso by 
Ravel, the orchestra had the 
near - capacity in the palms of 
their hands, up through and 
including the beautiful Dance 
from Salome, by R. Strauss, as 
the closer for the first half 

During intermission, there 
was much shuffling of the stage 
and instruments as a featured 
drummer and two guitarists 
moved to the fore, and after the 
concert resumed, decorum 
went sailing

Let it never be said that 
D SO  doesn't play the now 
sound Imagine if you can. a 
full symphonic treatment of 
modern ROCK Opening with 
the up - beat overture to Rock, 
the big group right on up the 
ladder It could have been the 
big - band sould that we older 
oldsters remember so fondly: 
Goodman, Dorsey, etc It was 
the big sound, but it was a 
different music As Conductor 
Andhel Brusilow said, the king 
of music, you tell the kids to 
turn down or off on their little 
radios Our personal pick was 
the symphonic Delihia.

A good sampling of the 
Beatles numbers (My Sweet 
Lord), Tom Jones, and surprise 
of surprises: five movements 
from Jesus Christ SuperStar. 
theme from tfie new movie 
Shaft, and also closing with the 
trombone - featured, rafter - 
rocking Beginnings made 
famous by Chicago.

As they say, you haven’t 
heard anything yet. but it was 
a different night at the concert

FULLEN MOTOR 
This Week 
In Eastland

THURSDAY FEBRUARY 3rd
Thursday Study Club 
American Legion 
V F W
Jr. Hi Basketball 
FRIDAY FEBRUARY 4th

Cisco at Eastland

F  REYSCHLAG
■ t i i k  w k a t h k k
Partly Cloudy. 
Much colder. 
Warming weekend

one candidate has filed in the 
Eastland Independent School 
District Board election, to be 
called for Saturday April 1.

The terms of Don Kinnaird 
and Bill B Hart expire and the 
unexpired term of the late 
Board President J.T. Gregory 
is to be filled

Mr. Kinnaird will seek re - 
election and Mr Hart was not 
available for comment 

Eugene Frost, 39. has filed 
for the vacancy created by the 
recent death of School Board 
President J.T. Gregory 

Filing deadline is March 3. 
Holdover trustees are Virgil 

T Seaberry Jr„ Bob Perkins, 
Winston Boles and Morris 
Jones

The election is expected to be

fifth in seniority.
During his twelve years in 

the Senate. Creighton has been 
chairman of the important 
Water and Conservation 
Committee, Privileges and 
Elections Committe and vice - 
chairman of the Senate 
Finance Committee For the 
past three sessions, he has 
served on the Appropriations 
subcommittee and the Senate - 
House Conference Committee 
on Appropriations, as well as 
the powerful Legislative 
Budget Board His con­
servative beliefs on spending 
have been evident during these 
years.

The newly constituted 22nd 
District includes the following 
counties Bosque. Comanche. 
Cooke, Denton. Eastland. 
Erath, Hill, Hood. Jack. 
Johnson, Montague. Palo 
Pinto, Parker, Somervell, 
Stephens. Wise and Young

Creighton and his wife, the 
former Sue Sparks . together 
with their three sons Will, 
Kenny and Mark reside in 
Mineral Wells where he is a 
practicing attorney

In making this an­
nouncement, the veteran 
Senator said, “ I believe that 
my re - election will prove to be 
of the utmost benefit to our 

District because of my past 
experience and seniority which 
will assure my appointment to 
the most important com­
mittees^

Jack Hetzel 
To Be Feted

A reception honoring Jack 
Hetsell of Jacksboro, 
Republican candidate for the 
House of Representatives. 
District 54, will be held in 
Eastland Monday at 3:30 p.m. 
(Feb 7) at Bellhurst Theater.

The public is cordially invited 
to attend it was announced by 
the local planners of the event.

r r r t -
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Williams Joins 
Ranger Faculty

EUGENE WILLIAMS 
...Joins RJC Staff 

Eugene F. Williams of 
Eastland, joined the Ranger 
Junior College faculty at the 
beginning of the Spring 
semester as Sociology In­
structor.

Mr. Williams received the 
Bachelor of Arts Degree from 
Johnson Bible College in 
Kimherlin Heights. Tennessee 
Following his graduation he 
served as pastor of the 
Christian Church in Bethesda. 
Ohio before entering the 
military service as Chaplain. 
He served as chaplain in the 
armed service until his 
retirement in 1966 

He earned a second BA 
degree from Hardin Simmons 
University in 1965 and his 
Masters' Degree from that 
same school in 1967 

During the fall of 1967 Mr. 
Williams began studying 
toward the Ph D degree in 
history at Texas Christian 
University in Fort Worth He 
has completed work on this 
degree which will be formally 
conferred in May this year 

Mr Williams is the pastor of 
the Christian Church in 
Eastland, Texas, where he 
resides with his wife. The 
Williams' have two children, 
both of whom are married and 
living away from home

called at a board meeting next 
week

Frost, administrator of 
Eastland Manor Nursing 
Home, is a four - year resident 
of Eastland, moving here from 
Brady He is married to the 
former Shirley Hodge of Lohn. 
They are the parents of three 
children, Randall 13, Janet 13, 
anf Scotty, 9

Frost, who is seeking pubkic 
office for the first time is a 
member of the Lions Club, the 
Quarterback Club, and is a 
director of the Chamber of 
Commerce.

Frost is a member of the 
Bethel Baptist Church, where 
he serves as deacon and church 
treasurer.

Countians 
Expected 
At Rally

A large delegation of 
Eastland Countians are ex­
pected to attend the Ben Barnes 
Home Country Rally in 
Brownwood Coliseum Thur­
sday. Feb 3, beginning at 7:30 
pm

County Coordinator James 
Reid reports that anyone who 
would like to attend, who 

might not have a ride, is 
welcome to contact him at 629 
- 1751. The county group is 
urging a good representation 
from this county at the official 
kick - off event in behalf of Lt. 
Gov Barnes' candidacy for 
governor.

Top country and western star 
Ray Price will provide en­
tertainment.

Persons from a 43 - county 
area and as far away as 100 
miles are expected for the 
Barnes statewide opening 

Eastland Countians are 
reminded that there will be 
signs on the convention floor 
designating the various areas 
and residents from here are 
being asked to join the county 
delegation

You Can Still 
Register!!
The new registration 

deadline to vote in the May 6 
party primaries is April 5 in­
stead of Jan. 31, Eastland 
County Tax Assessor - 
Collector Edgar Altom said 
Monday.

There has been a great deal 
of confusion about the new 
voter registration law passed 
by the last legislature. Mr. 
Altom said.

“ Under the new law, voters 
can register any time during 
the year,”  he explained 

“ However, persons must 
register at least 30 days prior to 
an election to be able to vote >n 
that election."

Mr Altom added that the 
deadline to register for the Nov.
7 general election will be Oct. 7.
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It’s Winter Again

This jumbo size snow man seems very happy with the job the Bill Wyatt family 
did on him at 302 W. Sadosa Photo  by H.D.  A l s u p

Committee Meet 
Thursday Eve

\  J
REP JOE HANNA

Hanna Speaks 
for Lions

State Rep Joe Hanna, called 
a "straight shooter" by 
program chairman E G Rice, 
spoke informally to members 
of the Eastland Lions Club at 
their regular luncheon meeting 
at the high school Tuesday 

Touching on a number of 
topics. Rep Hanna called this 
the "period of court decisions" 
as he spoke briefly on school

Bakker Funeral Home On Schedule With Work
Building his business from 

the ground up in the best 
American tradition 

That's Funeral Director Dale 
Bakker who is working vir­
tually around the clock, getting 
his new Bakker Funeral Home 
at 306 W. Plummer St ready 
for a scheduled mid - February 
opening

And the kind of work Dale s 
doing is not just pencil pushing 
and overseeing. 'Course, he’s 
doing plenty of that as any 

■

businessman must, but he's 
also laying to with the hammer, 
the saw and all the other things 
that it takes to convert a large, 
former dwelling into a modem, 
first rate funeral home and a 
beautiful asset to the com­
munity.

Discovery of a building error 
is working to Mr Bakker’s 
advantage When he was 
brought up short to learn that 
he was a 'building a little bit too 
close to the curb on the west, he

did some sharp pencil figuring 
and came up with even a better 
approach to providing the top - 
flight kind of service he en­
visions for his firm 

"I'm  doing my best to offer 
the best service and I want to 
be a good citizen and a solid 
part of this community I can 
assure you I'm working hard to 
do it Look at the blisters on my 
hands to prove it,”  Dale laughs, 
as he sees progress being 
made.

Bakker Funeral Home Soon To Be Completed Phrfoby hd Alsup’

Mr. Bakker, a licensed 
embalmer and funeral director 
for the past ten years, said that 
the new home will offer a 
complete funeral and am­
bulance service to all the 
people of Eastland and 
surrounding area 

Mr. Bakker came to Eastland 
in 1962 and is a well • known 
funeral director here He and 
Mrs Bakker have two children. 
Jeff. 8 and Jodie. 5 They live at 
712 S Ammerman St 

The new funeral home will 
feature a chapel with a seating 
capacity of approximately 200. 
facing west. and a family room 
for about 34 The casket display 
area will offer some 18 units, 
and two reposing rooms, sitting 
rooms and office space w ill fill 
the some 4.500 square feet, 
completely remodeled and 
modernized building 

One outstanding feature will 
be a covered driv eway for use 
by families on the east side of 
the building A private music 
room will be provided and 
parkfng areas will be to the 
south and east 

Bakker Funeral Home will 
offer pre - need funeral plans 
and honor all existing burial 
policies and pre need pians. 
Mr Bakker said 

To be offered will be a 24 - 
hour ambulance service

Much ground work is being 
done by Mr Durel Reids 
Special Committee on Librarv 
and Community Center, and a 
planning session for reports 
will be made Thursday 
evening, beginning at 7:30 p m 
at the Woman's Club House

taxation, district filing fees and 
other matters affected by 
recent court rulings 

Guessing that Gov Smith 
about June 1, “ This may pose 
some problems because about a 
third of the House and some 17 
senators will either be re - 
elected, ousted or elected to 
other positions in the May 
primary.

Rep Hanna spoke out for 
annual sessions mainly 
because the yearly meeting 
would provide better financing 
of the state's work load 

"We spend too much of our 
time fighting against’ things 
I'd like to be working 'for' 
constructive things." he said 

Most of the state's money 
goes to education, highways 
and welfare, he said " I  spend 
50 percent of my time helping 
persons with welfare matters " 

P r e s id e n t  D eG ord on  
presided

completely equipped with 
oxygen and other services as 
well as a licensed flying ser 
vice

Mr Bakker is the son of Mr 
and Mrs Albert Bakker who 
recently moved to Eastland 
from the family home in 
Youngstown. Q . and brother to 
Glenn Bakker. who recently 
assumed management of Lone 
Cedar Country Club 

A formal open house, with 
plans to be announced will 
mark the opening of the new 
business in February 

Mr Bakker came to Eastland 
from Temple where he worked 
in the funeral business for four 
years He met his wife Sue. 
there, where her mother still 
lives

A native of Youngstown, he 
served m the Air Force as an 
Air Policeman for four years in 
Korea and other stations After 
his discharge, he attended 
Howard Payne for one year, 
and graduated from the Dallas 
Institute of Funeral Directors 

At .16. he is a member of the 
Eastland City Commission.

Among the reports to be given 
will be some on__existing 
“ possible sites for a com­
munity center Serving on 
Durel's select group are 
presidents and - or 
representatives from just about 
every organization in town - - 
including

Mrs Beverly Nicholson. 
Civic League Mrs Herman 
Hassell, Las Leales; Dee 
Gordon. Lions Club, Saul 
Pullman. Rotary Club. Bob 
McCoy, Jaycees; Mrs J.F 
Francis. Thursday Afternoon 
Club. Mrs Virginia Russell. 
Music Club. Mrs Ginny 
Mathews, Xi Alpha Zeta.. Mrs 
Durel Reid. Club House Board 
Mrs Emily G Perkins, 
Librarv Committee Mrs Jim 
Horton. Mayor James Reid's 
special representative and 
Mrs Herman Alsup. Zeta Phi 
Sorority

Preliminary reports will be 
assembled and available for 
the Town Hall Meeting, set for 
Monday, Feb 7 at the Woman's 
( tub

NAME OMMITTED
In the long list of honor 

students from Eastland High 
School, the name of Janet 
Frost. Seventh Grade A 
Average student, was inad­
vertently left out and we think 
Janet's A Average certainly 
does deserve recognition

I've heard a little too much 
about "bridging the com­
munication gap lately Mind 
you. Pm all for it •• no one 
knows better than a newspaper 
man that communication ia a 
vital part of life It starta with 
two people that’s the minimum 
number

In this permissive society we 
seem to be nourishing, 
however, it is easy to point an 
accusing finger at our in­
stitutions "The schools, the 
churches th ey 're  not com­
municating with all the people, 
they're falling down on the 
job ”

It's easy to point your 
fingers, but maybe you're not 
really putting the blame where 
it belongs Remember, when 
you point a finger , three 
fingers are pointing back at 
you

One of the primary arena of 
failure. 1 think, is the family 
It 's trite but true that setting an 
example, the old business of 
bending the twig in the nght 
direction, is still a pretty good 
rule of life to follow

Parents either do the job of 
providing their children with a 
set of values, or it doesn't get 
done If they den t find such 
things as God. honesty, in­
tegrity. loyalty and duty at 
home in your own day - to - day 
living, then it may be loo late to 
pick up some of these hm- 
damenlal principles at aclrael 
or church.

Some folks laugh when you 
suggest that we return to some 
of the old - fashioned ways of 
living There is a lot of 
yesterday we don't need today, 
but some of it is worth hanging 
on to

The 1929 Dedication 
Ceremonies for the present 
Eastland County Court House 
was the text of Pat Miller's 
program at the regular 
meeting of the Eastland Rotary 
Club Monday. January II. at 
Eastland High School 
President Saul Pullman 
presided

According to the Official 
Program from the ceremonies, 
it was "An occasion of two 
fold interest, conducted by the 
general public, with the hearty 
co operation of the American 
l.cginn of Kaslland County". 
The affair was also a memorial 
service, as the Court House is 
dedicated to the men of 
Eastland County who served in 
World War I

In discussing the ceremonies 
that were held May 30, 1929, in 
Eastland. Mr. Miller outlined
the events ot the day:

Tackett Seeks County Sherifi
Bill Tackett. 49 year old 

Eastland County rancher, 
announces his candidacy for 
office of Sheriff for Eastland 
Count v

Mr Tackett, a five year 
veteran of World War II. at­
tended Cisco Junior College. He 
is married, and the father of 
two children. Michele. 16 and 
Bill Jr . age five Mrs Tackett 
(Wanda* ia business 
representative of Southwestern 
Bell Telephone Company ia 
Ranger

Mr Tackett was a candidate 
for this position in I9U. since 
that time he was associated 
with an oilfield equipment 
manufacturing company for IS 
years in a sales and public 
relation position. He returned 
in 1963 to his ranching interest 
in Eastland County. He says ha 
feels he ia qualified for this 
office and hopes to personally 
contact all of Eastland County 
voters to ask for their i

Rll.l. TACKETT m i
r - v  SA STLAM S,
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For Sale
;i%6 Chevy Pickup 4 spe<e<1 

“ transmission long wheel hase 
;h cvl May be seen at ion 
Bassett or call 62*2559 t tf

: VACUUM CLEANERS 
; sales and service 
> New and used 
i Phone - 1370
I t- 9

1957 Chevrolet. Bel Air Black &
• White, 327 V- 8 engine, Stan 

dard $350 00 Call 629 
1941 t- tfn

'Standel Artist Amp Brain and 
two cabinets one cabinet 2 

spkrs one cabinet 4 12 
»pkrs covers, wheels and all 
{look up cords Will sacrifice 
$01 6th St in Ranger Tel M7 
3424 after 5pm  t il
S• i
fence  building, anv kind, will 
4ham link, sell by foot or in­
stall Call 442 2197 405 West
$lth. Cisco
■

igfflima
ALL TYPES 

OF REAL ESTATE:

HOMES

forms

ranches

Financing Assistance

Listings reguested 
and long fist 

of good properties 
on hand

CALL US 
AND LH  
US SNOW 
YOU HOW 
WE CAN 

HELP YOU

TERRILL

REAL ESTATE
Farm Bureau Building 

Hiway 80 East 
Tel 629- 1725 Day *. 

Night call 629 2443 
Eastland Texas

Wanted N O T I C E  p o r  R e n j

Once a week lady needed for 
general house cleaning 629
2413

“ Any person qualified to vote 
who dnes not receive a ballot 
prior to March 13, 1972, may 
obtain one at his local County 
Agent's office "

WANTED: To rent 3 bedroom 
house within 10 mile radius of 
Eastland Contact Melvin C 
Brown 629 • 1023

“ The Truth About Mexico 
Dentures" Save $300 to $800 
Dentist names, addresses, 
prices, and complete in 
formation $1 00 per copy 
Henson Kesearch Co Box 
12432 El Paso. Texas 
79912 t- 10

NOTICE - M attresses' 
Complete bedding made by 
Western Mattress Co . San 
Angelo Best quality, low price, 
renovate or exchange new 
Every other Wednesday 
They 're guaranteed For home 
appointment call Lois Meazell. 
629 - 2703. leave name tf

mall 5 room cottage on top of 
park Hill 503 High street 
Unfurnished Only $35 per 
month Phone 629 1417 «- tf

2 bedroom unfurnished house , 
2 bedroom furnished mobil 
home, bills paid James T 
Wright. Call 629 1344 or after
five. 629 - 1074 t- tf

Thursday Club To Host Guests

JURY SAL is now a merry 
*1 She used Blue Lustre rug 

gnd upholstery cleaner Kent 
Alec Inc shampooer $1 Perry 
.Brothers t 11
? -------- -------------------------
i

tHANNAH'S husband Hector 
■plates hard work so he cleans 
' Ihe rugs with Blue Lustre Rent 
•.electric shampooer $1 Coats 
•Furniture t II 

'
(Tw o  Wooden overhead garage 
Odoors Ben Hamner loot S 
VSeaman t- tf tc
I;
(Sewing machine. Singer Dial A 
(■Stitch mends and darns All for 
*.•92.’ VO with free home 
lik-monslratiion Phone 629 
VlKM t 10

(

FOR SALE
M acres with real nice 3 
jhcdroom, 1 1, hath home with 
iorchard laxaied in Morton 
{Valley Community city water 
|l louse only 6 years old and in 
{excellent shape Price $22,000: 
jrnay assume $13.(410 note 
X'nnlact M L Terrell 629 1725
•or Buck W heal 629 2552

For Sale

Model 854 G E Dishwasher. 
$235 00
Model 5FK5 Westinghouse
Dishwasher. $225 00
Model Gnn 59SL. RCA Color TV.
$41X1 DO
Model WM 441 18. G E BAW 
TV $150 00
Mixlel WM 507 G E BAW TV.
SUM) 00
Mudel HK 4250 Westinghouse
Console TV $175 00
Ranger 8 Track Car Stereo w ith
speakers. $75 00
Call 629 2662 or SEE
(■midyear Serv ice Store on East
Main

FOR SALE 1961 Kronline 
Pickup, new leatherette seat
rovers S27S Mi
Nearly new complete snow 
rone ire machine with all 
supplies $HNi no 
I sect deep well pump and lank
Works good $65 00
Nice rrfimshed practice piano
$150.00
Nice 10 ft. slrrl slock (railer 
1150 00 wilh lights
Call Bob at the Dairy Treat 629 

1144 after 10 a m

MEETINGS
# #  + * #  + * * *  j*

MASONIC LODGE NO 467
-44 #«. $ « I i t  » l  r e

The Thursday Afternoon Club 
will meet at 3 p m Thursday in 
the Women's Club Building for 
a seated tea

The meeting date will also be 
guest day for members The 
Eastland County string quartet 
composed of Mrs Cyrus Frost 
J r . violin. Mildred Pickrell. 
violin Mrs Tom Wilson, cello; 
Mrs Winnifred Hitt son viola, 
will present a medley "Hearts 
and Flowers'' arranged by-

members of the quartet 
Program chairman is Mrs Guy 
Patterson

Also on the program will be 
an original poem by Mrs 
Patterson entitled ' The Prayer 
of a Flower" and Mrs l.C. 
Inzer will present, " I  Gave My 
Heart Away."

In charge of hospitality will 
be Mmes E R Townsend. 
Floyd Robertson. Ed Ethridge 
and Cecil Colling*

Mellow -Drama 
Developing

Meets second Thursday of each 
month at 7 30 p m in the 
Masonic Hall Call Pat Miller 
W M at 629-1077 or L E 
Jlluckahuy sec y at 629 1391 for 
inlormation ______

Eastland Civic Theatre's 
first production of 1972 is 
tentatively set for early March 
and rehearsals are reportedly 
going smoothly 

"Pure as the Driven Snow" is 
a comedy "melodrama”  in 
three acts written by Paul 
Loomis It's a tale of a per 
secuted heroine whose virtue 
triumphs over villainy!

Fine printing available at the 
Telegram calling cards from 
$9 95 for 500 your own personal 
letterhead from $9 20 for 500 
personalized envelopes from 
$8 15 per 500. padded 
statements, from $8 30 to peer 
Bigger values in larger lots 
You can get it printed at the 
Telegram t- tf

l^rge selection of suitable gift 
and personal books for gift 
giving and your own use See 
the complete line at the 

. } t- tf

MERCER'S APPLIANCE 
SERVMf

Dishwashers - Washers - 
Dryers - Stoves - Disposals - 
Ovens

(• R MERCER
Telephone 653 
Texas 76466

P. O. Box 34 
2473 Olden.

Saul Pullman president

Meets each Monday at White 
Elephant Restaurant in 
Eastland 12 no noon 
EASTLAND ROTARY CL IB

Rebeckah 
Lodge 177

A 4th
300 N

Meetings each 2nd 
Monday at 7 30 p m 
I at mar St

Sec'v Dorothy Await
Phone 629-1662

FREE
Estimates on new

r o o f s  o n l y

Repair of  ̂our 
(M<1 Roof* 

Rc-irit-ntinl and 
Commercial

“ALL \K\*
WORK

GLAR W TEED" 
TRI-CITIES 

ROOFING CO. 
(.ill

Ntibil Squiers 
629-2370 

EASTLAND

Helen Cranford 
Travel Service 
Representative

f e 6.5.---  l U - j  t  i J -

I 
1 
I 
I 
I 
I

24 Hour Service

EMMET M0RREN 
PLUMBING

< M a u n  r e p a ir
SERVICE 

1015 W Main
629-2092

VI \A BE YOl DON'T NEED 
INSURANCE 

If you don t own a home 
furniture, jewelry or a car you 
can get along without the 
services of an insurance agent 
But for the most of us life is not 
that simple Modem living has

become so complex that the 
protection of^property and 
personal liability is a major 
problem and we must be in­
sured The individual you can 
always depend on for accurate 
solutions of your insurance 
problems Is /our local agent

Earl Bender & Company
Eastland Insurance since 1924 Texas

...............r r r r r r r r t r r t i ?

Two major characters have 
been chosen Purity Dean, the 
heroine will be Debbie 
Whaley, and John Frost will 
play Leander Ixingfellow, the 
hero Both are EHS students 

Mrs Virginia Weaver 
Russell is director and 
rehearsals have been in 
progress for a week 

More information will be 
announced soon

1

Ĉ ard of 
Thanks

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Mrs Linnie 
Walker wishes to thank the 
many friends who responded so 
graciously during the loss of 
our Mother The many 
beautiful flowers, cards and 
food, and the visits and com­
forting words

Special thanks to Dr. 
Treadwell and the staff at the 
Manor Nursing Home

The Children of 
Mrs Linnie Walker

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to express our heart­
felt thanks to our good neigh­
bors and friends for each kind 
word of sympathy, each kind 
deed and the beautiful floral 
offerings and music extended 
to us during the veil of sadness 
we are passing through in the 
death of our dear Oral C Rich

Go Bless you

I
"We can handle arvything 

but litterbugs "
Goode Ffest Control

Phone 629 - 1179 after 3:00 
310 N Ammerman 

roaches, ants, termites, 
moths, spiders

jAM -.W oR J^U  AKA NTEED I

HELP WANTED

Registered Nurse for 
director of nurses 
Breckenridge Nursing 
Home Call 559 2717 for 
interview Breckenridge, 
Texas

MARY COME HOME

NOTICE
Liles, brakes & 
running gears in­
stalled. 4̂11 Types 
of New Trailers 
For Sale.

Roy Cozart 
1107 W. 15th 

442-1912

I

ABC0
Plumbing l  

Hooting
Contracting and

Repairing 
Complete Plumbing 

Service 
C a l 629-1200 
Day or NHa

BOB WILLIAMS 
Master Plumber 

Serving Texans 
25 years

POLITICAL
ANNOUNCEMENTS

For Countv Sheriff:
Bennie Moseley
L. E. (Lefty! Sublet! (Re-Election

County Commissioner,
Pot. 1 Danny Woods

91st District Court
Earl Conner Jr.
(Re-Election!

State Representative,
District 54
Joe Hanna

Constable Precinct 1
Bill Hunter

Criminal District Attorney 
(Un-Expired term}

Emory Walton

County Tax Assessor-Collector 
Nancy Trout 
Eddie Pietraszek

Senate, 22nd District
Toni Creighton (Re-Election!

j & l T E I B G R A M
6291707

11 W Commerce St. Eastland. Texas 76448

Consolidated with Eastland Chronicle, established in 1887, and 
Eastland County Record, established in 1931

H.V. O'BRIEN. Publisher and Editor 
HERMAN ALSUP. Associate Editor

Second Class Postage paid at Eastland Texas under Act of 
Congress on March 1870.
Published semi weekly - Thursdays and Sundays by Eastland 
County Newspapers, Inc

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: By carrier in city, 15 c a week or 65 c 
a month; one year by mail incounty. $5; city P O Boxes. 16; one 
year elsewhere in state, $7; out of state, $8

NOTICE: Any erroneous reflection upon the character,
standing, or reputation of any person, firm or corporation which 
may appear in the columns of this newspaper will be gladly 
corrected upon being brought to the attention of the editor

since •  • • 1962

Roy’s Complete 
Whirlpool Appliance Center

629-2474 Roy Gann 205 S. Lamar

Poodle Grooming 

Telephone

647-1288 -• 647-1845
£TTTTTTTTT IT7777TV |

R O Y  LEE SM ITH :
PLUMBING ;

Contracting and Repairing £ 
Complete Plumbing fixtures* 

and Supplies J 
Bath & Kitchen •  

•

iUTTON'f
A-l Office 
Machines

Call 629-1707 <
Eastland

SCHOOL MENU

Thursday Erb. 3
Home made chili 
Pinto beans 
Buttered spinach 
Cabbage A carrot salad 
Raisin cobbler 
Corn bread

Friday Feb. 4 
Hamburgers 
Buttered corn
Pimento cheese sandwiches 
Jello with pineapple

Improvements

Trained. Adequate Staff 
Call a Licensed Plumber 

Day or Night 
629 1722

SMITH 
PLUMBING •

114 N. Seaman

Eastland

/ ^ m E R i c / q r v

f \ / T T i o r \ / T L
i i a s u r ^ i a c e  c o m p ^ i r w

r~W"l Hoot ofnci cAivtsum if«»s nysrnq
H. W . Hcrwcek - Agent 

Office 629-1512 
Hume 629-1288

SOUTHLAND
LIFE 

INSURANCE
M. H. PERRY
100 S. Seaman

629-1566 
629-1095

sympathy
and

advica...

WE ARE HERE TO 
SERVE T0U

Whatever the hour, 

feel free to cafi on

us for understanding 
counsal in time of 
sorrow.

Arrington
Funeral
Home

Eastland

629-2611

M W M M W M

M Y DAD

WANTS 
TO

INSURE 
YOUR 

CAR

CALL 

D. L. Kinnaird 

General Insurance
207 W. Main 629-2544

REAL ESTATE

GARDENHIRE 
OIL COMPANY

Yes! We can sell wholesale to you!
See us for all your oil. grease, filters, spark plugs, j 
brake fluid, anti freeze, S. T. P. for oil, gasoline, 
diesel or radiator, tires for cars, truck or tractor.

|  WE HAVE TANKS for farm or commercial 
|  gasoline and diesel fuel. See us before you trade.
|  All major brands of Oil and Grease.
I WHY PAY MORE??
qMiitiaiuMiiitiiaiiiiiitiiiiiaiiiiiiiiiiiiciiiiiiiiiiiiiaiiHiii'iiiioiiiiitHHiiaiiiHi^

Want to buy older house or lot, 

629-1992. If no answer, 

817,485-0767. Or write 

Box 583. Eastland. Texas 76448

l-arge 2 bedroom house, needs > 
some repair So Daugherty St >
$8 IN N )I HI

hdrm house, good roof S 
Seaman $5500 mi 
Small 2 bdrm 3 lots $2500 mi 
Smith St

hdrm house, frame. Hanger > 
large lol $1500 00 
2'. lidrm Needs repair. 8 pecan 
trees, approx I 1.- ac . Hiway 80 
Ranger $5500 on 
Small 2 hdrm house, garage, 
large lot $;mmxi mi 
«irge 2 bedroom frame. 4 lots, 

in good repair. $55<x) on 
Nice 3 bedroom brick. Cisco 

lx-droom frame house. 2 
baths. Burkett St $8,ooo mi 

bedroom frame house. 2 lots, 
garage Mulberry St $4 75o mi 

3 bedroom brick, double 
garage, fair Ranger 

liedroom. I ac city water A 
well. 2 baths, some pecan trees 
llden

Extra nice t bedroom brick. I t 
acres. 70 pecan trees. Coastal 
Bermuda. 2 wells, tank, all
lectric

4 ac 2 bedroom, city water, lots 
xian trees Olden 
i Ixilroom rock home, 11 acres 

M fM  orchard, large barn
Mdcn

FARMS A RANCHES 
hii acre I  bedroom house, 
miles out $14, immi mi 
194 acres, some lake frontage 
pecan trees close in 
210 acres, cleared native 
pasture, pecan trees A creek 
tmttom. net fences Will sub 
divide for G I $150 00 per acre 
40 acres 3 bedroom house 
Some improved grasses South 
part of County $17,000.00.
I acres 38 cult balance brush 

17 acre peanut allot Water > 
well 6 miles from Ranger. Will i 

<111 or owner will finance 
120 acres, 200 native pecan 
Irecs. 3 tanks. 20 acres Coastal 
approx 20 acres bottom on 
Sabanna River good grass.

< 160 acres near Cisco, will 
subdivide for G I 
45acres-10 cult on Interstate20 
near Cisco
14,000 acres improved No 
Texas ranch. Will consider 
trade
2.800 acre improved Lampasas 
Co ranch Running water.
1.750 acre ranch, some clear 
excellent hunting. good 
location
Well improved 1000 acre ranch 
with cheap int rate. Will ' 
consider tome clear trade for
equity.
Several nice cabins at Lake!
I-eon and also 2 nice lots on 
South Side
We have large and small
Motels in thr area for 
trade
For these and other 
contact

tfirfcAlfi ”
REAL ESTATE 

100 South Seaman 
Eastland. Texas 629-1781 
Robert M Kincaid 
629 2721

U n u a f e L i t t : » g u
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Patients in Hanger General 
Hospital Wednesday morning 
were:

Gerald Lee 
Walter Henry 
Leslie Winnegar 
Patsy Patterson 
Beulah Hamilton 
Opal Patton 
Elva Taylor 
Jim Casey 
Mary Deitz 
Floyd Smith 
Erma Polk 
Henry Hamilton 
Anna Anderson 
Travis Reese 
J.C. Carter 
Kathleene Nowak 
Helen Hagaman 
Glover L. Smith 
Beverly Bryan 
Mrs W B Griffith 
Patients in the Eastland 

Memorial Hospital Tuesday 
were:
1 Vernon Davis, Gorman 

Homer Williams, Comanche 
Otis Guy, Carbon 
Cora Hardin 
Myrtle Gray 
James Harrison

"DANCE'
at

VERNON'S
in

Strawn, Texas
SATURDAY

and
SUNDAY

Recording Star 
From MGM

PAM
NORTON

also
Jerry, Gerald

and
MUSIC 

MAKERS

John Cozart, Cisco.
Diane Mahaney.
Belle Jones 
Weltha Dunn, Carbon. 
Barbara Gregory, DeLeon. 
Anna Wright.
Young Wright.
Millie Waldrep, Cisco.
Mary Johnson. Cisco.
Blanch Files, Gorman 
Barbara Brinkley 
Effie Sharp, Olden.
Susie Howard.
Hattie Duncan 
Mattie Davis, Gorman 
Adrian Swindle, Cisco.
Joe Tow,
Ethelyne Niver 
Mildred Culwell, Rising Star 
Sue Hamilton, Olden 
Mary Burns. Comanche 
Winona Goode.
Edith Wooten, Cisco.
Edna Thompson, Cisco. 
Henry Pence, Rising Star 
John Armstrong 
Addie Faulkenberry, Rising 

Star
M i l l i e  B a g g e t t ,  

Breckenridge 
Sharon Rogers 
Baby girl Olvera 
Baby girl Miller, Clyde 
Morris Jones.
Robert Hodge 
Eva Davis.

Claude Greenlee 
Treta Vogel, Ranger 
Ruth Haney 
Winnie Sue 
Estelle Roff.
Yvonne Revels, Ranger 
Eva Butler 
Joyce Pesnell

Homer Duncan 
Elmer Bisbee, Cisco.
Myrtle Richardson 
George Norris.
Elnora Washington 
Arda Tibbs.
Sue Wood, Cisco.

Mertie Jones, Cross Plains 
Ola Childers, Rising Star 
Lucille Atwood, Carbon 
Clarice Seago 
Delores Olvera,
Zelma Willoughby 
Willard Vogel 
Till Harbin 
Rebecca Horton 
Dana Miller. Clyde 
Ruby Crawley.

HD NEWS
By Janet Thomas County 
Home Demonstration Agent

CMDR. JESSE E. BETHANY

Area Naval Officer 
Receives Commendations

Commander Jesse E. 
Bethany, executive officer of 
the Charleston Weapons 
Station, Charleston. South 
Carolina, received three 
medals during ceremonies last 
week The medals were 
awarded by Rear Admiral H.J. 
Kosser, Commandant of the 
Sixth Naval District.

Cmdr Bethany received the 
Bronze Star for meritorious 
service while in combat in 
Vietnam from November 1970 
to November 1971 

He was also awarded the 
Navy Commendation Medal 
and the Vietnamese Staff 
Service Honor Medal First 
Class He is credited with 
establishing new movements 
and cargo clearance 
procedures and implementing 
resupply efforts to Cambodia 
while serving as operations 
officer of the Military’ Sealift 
Command office 

Cmdr. Bethany is an 
Eastland County native. He 
graduated from Carbon High 
School in May, 1942, and en­
tered the Naval sendee in 
No\-ember that same year He

H E I D E N H E I M E R ' S
Polyester
OUBLE KNITS

[60 inches wide, AN First Quality 
• 1 to 5 yard cuts.

Reg. $3”  to *5** values 
Were marked S3M
Special
for Wed. 
A Thurs. 2.88
One Big Table

:qtton blends
45 inches wide, mostly heavy 
weight sports wear fabrics - 
sofids and prints 

1 Reg. 99* yd.
Wed. A Q O C
1 Thurs. ONLY

Men's & Boy's

SWEATERS
Were 499 to W

NOW
*3° ° » * 14“

served in both the Pacific and 
Atlantic during World War II.

Previous assignments in­
clude Commandant of the 
Naval O fficers’ Com­
munication School in New Port 
Rhode Island, and prior to his 
tour of duty in Vietnam he was 
Commander of a mine sweeper 
division operating out of 
Charleston, South Carolina.

Cmdr Bethany and his wife. 
Nancy have their home in 
Charleston. S.C. They have two 
sons, Peter, at home, and 
David who is a freshman 
student at Clemson University.

He is the son of Mrs. Ocie 
Bethany of 4329 Diaz Ave. Fort

The Texas Tourist 
Development Agency, Austin, 
Texas has developed plans for 
holding the first annual Texas 
State Arts and Crafts Fair on 
the Schreiner Institute Cam 
pus. the Kerrville, Texas on 
May 31st. - June 4, 1972 This 
will be the first such fair for 
Texas The Arts and Craft Fair 
will offer Texas Craftsmen an 
opportunity to exhibit and sell 
their arts and crafts.

Applications for entering the 
Fair are due on March 3rd 
Applications for craftsmen in 
Eastland County are available 
at the County Home Demon­
stration Agent’s Office, states 
Mrs Janet Thomas. Co Home 
Demonstration Agent

The following is some in­
formation that may answer 
many of your questions in 
regards to entering the Fair

1. The fair is open, upon in­
vitation, from the Selection 
Committee, to Texas resident 
artists and craftsmen only.

2. It is created and sponsored 
by the Texas Tourist 
Development Agency with 
support and assistance from 
numerous other state agencies, 
tourist organizations and art 
and craft groups

3. It will be promoted and 
advertised nation - wide

4. The first - year attendance 
is expected to be in the tens of 
thousands

5 Buyers from national retail 
outlets will be guests of the fair 
and will be encouraged to 
negotiate quantity contracts 
with exhibitors.

6 The fair will be held in a 
rural, outdoor atmosphereWorth, Texas.

NNRMAMmMMAMMMMMmMMMMMMrtMMMMMUMU*

utilizing tents and displays 
areas Hours will be 10 a m to 
dusk

7 Exhibitors will be provided 
free space

8 Accommodations will be 
available in dormitory 
facilities of Schreiner Institute, 
home of the first fair, at 
reasonable cost. Excellent 
hotel facilities are available in 
Kerrville, Camping facilities 
are available at Kerrville State 
Park and other locations 
around Kerrville

9 Schreiner Institute will 
provide exhibitor meals at 
reasonable cost Con­
cessionaires at the fair will 
offer a variety of food and 
drink

10. Exhibitors will be en­
couraged to work at and 
demonstrate their skills duri 
the fair

11. Everything exhibitet 
must be for sale

12. The fair will arrange] 
security for exhibits and| 
exhibitors revenues.

13. The fair will charge’ 
exhibitors 15 percent com­
mission on all sales made at the 
fair to visitors No commission 
will be charged on quantity 
contracts negotiated by 
craftsmen with retail buyers. 
Exhibitors would be expected 
to advise fair officials of all 
quantity contracts so that the 
success of that portion of the 
program can be evaluated

14 The fair will operate 
several demonstration exhibits 
and receive, in full, any 
revenues produced by them 
These exhibits will in no way 
compete with individual 
exhibitors (i.e., com grinding 
operation).

15. The fair is particularly

interested in locating "old  
time" craft skills, i.e., spin­
ning, lye soap making. 
bUcksmithing. etc

16 The fair will charge ad­
mission to visitors 'probably 
$1 00 for adults. 6 50 for 
children i.

17 Fair officials will do 
everything possible to make 
exhibitors stay as comfortable, 
pleasant, and profitable as 
possible

Weekend guests of Mr- 
and Mr* W.H Gay were Mr 
and Mrs Ralph Hall of Lawton. 
Okla , Mr and Mrs Ralph Gay 
and family of Arlington and Mr 
and Mrs Johnny Gay and 
family of Irvin

The following proceedings 
were had in the Court of Civil 
Appeals. Eleventh S Supreme 
Judicial District of Texas: 

Reversed and Remanded
Beneficial Finance Company 

of Amarillo v W.H. Van Shaw 
(Opinion on motion for 
rehearing by Judge McCloud). 
- - Potter

Johnnye Pat Estes et al v. 
Bank of Commerce (Opinion 
by Judge Walter). - - Taylor 

Motions Submitted
Beneficial Finance Company 

of Amarillo v W.H. Van Shaw 
Appellee's motion for 
rehearing. - - Potter.

Carroll R Rogers v. Trinity 
Universal Insurance Company 
Agreed motion to amend 
transcript - - Taylor

K S. Sparks et al v. James 
Egli et ux Joint motion to 
dismiss the appeal - - Palo 
Pinto.

Dale Harlow v. Swift and 
Company Agreed motion for

extension of time 
pedant's briefs - -

Dale Harlow v. Swift and 
Company Agreed motion to 
supplement transcript - - 
Brown.

Dale Harlow v. Swift and 
Company. Agreed motion to 
supplement transcript. - - 
Brown

Motions Granted
Carroll R Rogers v. Trinity 

Universal Insurance Company- 
Agreed motion to amend 
transcript - - Taylor

K.S. Sparks et al v. James 
Egli et ux Joint motion to 
dismiss the appeal - - Palo 
Pinto.

Dale Harlow v. Swift and 
Company Appellant’s motion 
for extension of time to file 
statement of facts. - - Brown.

Dale Harlow v. Swift and 
Company. Agreed motion for 
extension of time to file ap­
pellant's briefs. - - Brown.

Machine Operators Needed.
Apply in person,

Thursday, Feb. 3 al 9:30 a.m.

Hollywood Vassarette
202 N. College Eastland, Texas

Equal Opportunity Employer

■ i
%»*

r-

RANGER DRIVE - IN 
T H E A T R E

BOX OFFICE OPENS 6:45 " 
PICTURE STARTS 7:15

FRI1. - S A T . - S U N .
Feb ruary  4th, 5th and 6th

Auction Sale
S A T U R D A Y , F E B R U A R Y  5, 19 72

One o 'c lo ck  P. M.
DR. C. E. PAIL RESIDENCE, 708 AVE. I, CISCO, TEXAS

Dl E TO THE DEATH OF DR. C. E. PA l L. WE WILL SELL AT PUBLIC AUCTION THE FOL­
LOWING ITEMS:

S A B A T A  
A I M S  T O  K I L L

. and his gun does 
the rest!

NEEDLE POINT ANTIQUE BENCH 

PIE CRUST TABLE -  DESK 

BED ROOM SUITES -  RUGS 

RECORD rLAYER — ROCKING CHAIRS 

ROLLA-WAY BED — SWAG LAMP 

CHEST OF DRAWERS — TEA CART 
PIANO k  BENCH -  BRIDGE TABLES 
ELECTRIC RANGE — COAT TREE 
LAWN MOWER — TOOLS 
(.AS HEATERS — LAMPS — SHEETS
POTS A PANS----  BED SPREADS
WOODEN HIGH CHAIR — T V TABLES

SEVERAL NICE CHAIRS -  SOFA 

BATHROOM SCALES — BOOK SHELVES 

SMOKING STANDS — ORIENTAL RUG 

TABLES OF ALL KINDS — GLIDER 

VACUUM CLEANER — CHINA DISHES 

MARBLE TOP TABLE — MIRRORS 
DINNETTE SUITE — DISHES 
FRIGIDAIRE REFRIGERATOR — DISHES 
AUTOMATIC WASHER -  TOWELS 

AIR CONDITIONERS — BLANKETS 
PARSONS TABLE — VANITY 
STEP LADDER — YARD TOOLS

Y u i  B r y n n e r  Dean Reed

SABATA

PLAN NOW TO ATTEND
IN CASE OF BAD VUEATHE3. SALE W ILL BE h ATI ON I MSI 131

susan scon 
Gl* COLOR “ w-

7

I WRIGHT AUCTION COMPANY
JAMES T. W RIGHT LICENSED AUCTIONEER

210 So. Seaman Street—Bus. Plione 817 629-1344 — Eastland Texas — Res Phone 817, 629-1074

V
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Carbon News
H> Mrs. Bub Hastings

An ordination service was 
hold Sunday afternoon in the 
Carbon Baptist Church fro the 
purpose of ordaining Lynn 
Hagan as a deacon The 
presbytery consisted of the 
following men Rev Jim

Roberts. Moderator. Charles 
Morgan Clerk. Jesse Hagan. 
Al Anderson. Bud Clack. Newt 
Hart and Chester Allen from 
East Cisco Baptist Church, 
Henry Hines, C L Rogers, D D 
Sandlin. R Holloway, and Rev 
R B Murrav all of Carbon

Ret Joe O'Neal and Horace 
Browning of Kokomo Baptist 
Church Rev Steve laingford 
and Robert Hagaman of 
Pleasant Hill; Rev Eric 
Lovell, pastor at Long Branch 
Ret Wallace Pierce, pastor at 
Olden Wayne Webb. Calvary 
Baptist Church Cisco; and 
Roland Earp of Okra Church 
Ret Richard Watson. Got-

Mangum and Rev. Bennie 
Hagan of San Angelo Rev Jim 
Roberts questioned Mr Hagan, 
the candidate. The Ordination 
prayer was by Mr. Jesse 
Hagan, father of the candidate 
Ret Bennie Hagan, brother of 
the candidate delivered the 
message

Mrs Claude Ingram and son 
C P and Mr and Mrs Newtman. Rev. A J Thomas of

*

AAOIMTGOA/VERY

Hagan of Cisco visited in 
Carbon and attended the or­
dination service for Mr. Lynn 
Hagan

Mrs W ilia Mae Hendricks of 
Eastland visited Mrs. Floyd 
W oods Friday afternoon

Mr and Mrs. L.D Aten of 
lelia Lake visited her sister 
and family. Mr and Mrs. C.L.

Rogers and her brother Mr and 
Mrs. John Guy last week

Mr. and Mrs. Williams of 
Olden visited Saturday af­
ternoon with Mr and Mrs 
George Bridges

Harvey Files of Grand 
Prairie and his mother Mrs 
Pearl Files of Gorman visited

their brother and son Mr and 
Mrs Clarence Files Wed­
nesday

Mrs Rusty McGinty of Plaits 
spent the weekend with Mr and 
Mrs Truman Been

Mrs Ford Powell of Paducah 
and Mrs J O. Houser of 
Plainview visited Mrs Callie 
Vaughn Sunday and Mondav

a  i  j

Warehouse Overflow
A

L

BIG SAVINGS ON RANGES, STEREOS, TV ’S,
WASHERS, DRYERS, REFRIGERATORS, MORE!

FREE DELIVERY THESE 3 DAYS O N L Y ^ S lf? !

!\= r-

KH

FREEZERS
21 cu. ft. I pright 1910 *219 

2.1 cu. ft. Chest 1610 199H8 

10 cu. ft. Chest 8091 13 7 ™

i T V ’s
2.» Golor Console 17821 579°°
25 Color Console J7521 529“

19 Color Portable 12441 319“
B A W Portable ) n /,1 6988 ,
R A W Portable 1 ] 4-42 9288
B A W Portable 1 | |.I2 6788
R A W  Portable 11861 82 ,,r>

GARBAGE
COMPACTOR

Model 5000 *189kk

Electric Range
Continuous Clean Oven and VI arm- 
ing Shelf Model 1.171*269**

e  have several excellent b u y s  

in Trade-in and repossessed 
merchandise

’Bring in this coupon fort

'1 < »  I ‘ 2 0
• Purchase Price 

$100.00 To $200.00

lOO
OFF

Purchase Price 
Over $200.00

\ On Any Major Appliance from *
THIS AD OR FROM*

; Any of Our Sale Catalogs,
or General Catalog. ;

«

OFFER GOOD FEB 3 - 1 - s i

BUY NOW  
START MONTHLY

PAYMENTS IN JUNE
On Selected Major Purchases

FINANCE CHARGES 
re applicable on these purchase 

during the deferred period.

Lawn & Garden
14 HI* Tractor with 48” mower 
0  Mod. 33046 *899*°

5 HP Heavy Duty Tiller

Mod. 1589 167“

5 HP Tiller Mod. 1580 164“

19" Electric Start Mower
Mod. 259 117*8

Electric Mower
Mod. 271 6995

20“ 3Vi HI* We believe this is 
the safest, best cutting rotary 
mower on the market today.

Prepaid 109®*

Reciitiers - Rockers

Model 61708 7488

Model 60530 39“

Model 60730 4988

Model 61828 9 4 ™

NO TRADE-IN REQUIRED ON ANY 
HOME APPLIANCE AT WARDS!

FAST, EXPERT SERVICE, PARTS 
AVAILABl E f r o m  c o a s t -t o -c o a s t

REFRIG ERATO RS
16.5 cu. ft. Top Freezer 1642 269*8 
14 cu. ft. Top Freezer 1459 239** 
17 cu. ft. Side by Side 1871 28488 
20 cu. ft. 3 door with ice maker 

Model 2170 *479“  
WASHERS - DRYERS

Dryer - Harvest Gold 7729 , LP>1 
Dryer - Harvest Gold 7631 159“
Dryer- White 7421 149
Washer Harvest Gobi 6631 209“

BUY ANYTHING YOU NEED AT ANY WARDS STORE WITH A CHARG-ALL ACCOUNT—SAY "CHARGE ITI"

M 0Jt* W A R D S 214 E* E. Main Eastland 9 a.m. - 5 p.m. Ph. 629-2618 Transportation extra i?
Jr.

Mr and Mrs Clarence Files 
spent Sunday with Mr and 

Mrs. J C. Foreman of Olden

Mrs Jewel Jackson spent 
Iasi week with Mr and Mrs 
Drew Dan Jackson of Cisco

Mr and Mrs Dennis Clower 
and family of Jacksboro and 
Mr and Mrs Roy Eisenbach 
and family of San Angelo at­
tended ordination services of 
their brother Lynn Hagan in the 
Carbon Baptist Church Sunday 
afternoon

Gordon
News

Bv Mrs. Paul Rexroal

Several changes have taken 
place for Methodist ministers 
in Central Texas, due to the 
death of the Rev Thomas B 
Granger, pastor of Couts 
Memorial United Methodist 
Church in Weatherford The 
Rev James Lane, pastor of the 
First United Methodist Church 
of Gordon and the Methodist 
Church at Santo for the past 2 «* 
years has been reassigned to 
the Methodist Church in Frost 
and he will also serve Mertens 
and Irene Methodist Churches 
The Rev Woody McClendon, 
pastor of the Blum United 
Methodist Church will serve the 
Gordon Santo circuit. 
Changes are effective Feb 15

Mr and Mrs Ray Jones. 
Debbie and Karen of Fort 
Worth and Mr and Mrs Don 
Stoner of Eastland visited 
Sunday w ith Mrs Fppie Archer 
and Charles

Mr and Mrs Roger Boone. 
Thomas and Sheila visited 
Sunday in Jacksboro with Mr 
Boone's parents Mr and Mrs 
H H Boone

Mrs Alma Ball spent the 
weekend in Fort Worth visiting 
her sister. Mrs Etta Warren

Mr and Mrs Ira Mayo of 
Hico visited Sunday with Mrs 
Hettie Mayo. Mr and Mrs 
Jack Craddock. Mr and Mrs 
Hill Mayo. Mr and Mrs Boyd 
Hart and Mr and Mrs Avis 
Boyd

Mr and Mrs l-arry Jackson 
ind Daniel and Deanna Parker 
til of Odessa spent Friday nigh) 
with their grandparents. Mr 
and Mrs Dewey MiSJueary

Mr and Mrs. Webb Spear 
spent the weekend in Mineral 
Wells with her parents. Mr and 
Mrs F L Roberson and helped 
celebrate Mrs Roberson's 85th 
birthday Sunday

Saturday visitors in the home 
erf Mrs Hugh Segars were 
Mrs Alverda Edwards and 
Mrs Janie Segars and son, 
Paul all of Fort Worth

Weekend visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs George 
Stockstill were Mr. and Mrs 
Jerry Reynolds. Melissa and 
Steven and Mr and Mrs Frank 
Richardson and Brian all of 
Fort Worth and Clarence 
Stockstill and Dodie of 
Weatherford

Several from here attended 
funeral services at the Baptist 
Church in Mingus Tuesday at 
2:30 p m for Mrs Nina Choate, 
who died Sunday morning in 
Ranger General Hospital

Mr and Mrs. Orval Rexroal 
of Eastland visited Mr and 
Mrs Rome Thrailkill and Mrs. 
Mary Rexroal Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs Mike Mackey 
and daughter, Angie of Fort 
Worth visited Saturday with 
Mr and Mrs Boyd Hart and 
Mr and Mrs. Avis Bjyd.

Mrs. Winifred Knoop of 
Mineral Wells visited several 
days last week with Mrs Tom 
Spear

Movies of the activities of the 
First United Methodist Church 
of Gordon for the past 2 tk 
years will be shown Sunday 
evening, Feb 6 at tha 
Methodist Church. After the 
movies are shown an ad­
ministrative board meeting 
will be held
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s a f e w a y J LOW, LOW PRICES EVERY DAY %  SPECIALS!
■ ~  \ S r - ^  ^

F r o z e n  F o o iViennas
S a u u f* . Swift

1 Safeway R1; .  s i
F  Special! %/  Cans X

Cake Mixes
Batty Crocker. Assorted 

$ ‘Safeway
Special! 3 $1

18 Vi-oi. ^  |  
Boxes X

Hunt *. Hoorty Flavor!
Tomato Sauce

ror!

1Safeway
Special! 10 S-oi.

Cans

Great American Soups
a tel

$
*  Chick** N**(l* w 
t  B*e* o ff* Imaba,
*  ChtchM « c. wM*
* Cm* *f MulXr*.
* I put Pm with In
*  Vafa'abi* wit* ftc
*  V.ya'abla (Ml
*  Chill (Ml

M ix or Match!

Special! 5  ~ $1W  Cons X

Cocktail
Stokely. Colorful!

k
Safeway
Special!

16-oi.
Cans * Y

K M .

Fruit Drink
Del Monte

Pineapple-Grapefruit

Q . . J 1
V  Cans X

Safeway
Special!

Safeway
Special!

Vi-Gal. 
Ctns.

Facial Tissues
or*

$■

Puff*. Assorted Color*

Safeway
Special! 4 200-Ct.

Boxes

Mix or Match
Town House Vegetables

Mellorine
Joyett. Assorted Flavors

1
Meat Pies

1

Bel-air. Assorted
Cream Pies

$1
Bel-air. Pure. From Florida

Safeway
Special!

Safeway
Special!

Swanson. Assorted

A Cream Style Golden Corn 
A Whole Kernel Golden Corn 
A  Apple Sauce
A Green Peas or
A Cut Green Beans C h o ic e / 5 16-ox.

Cans

'
Everyday Low PricesI

Shortening
Velkay. N r lakl.q or Pryla«t —S-lfc. Coe

E n r ic h e d  F lo u r  
C a n e  S u g a r  e—
S a la d  D re s s in g  
C h u n k  T u n a  Sot 

T o m a t o  C a ts u p  
H o rm e l S p a m

Check These Low Pricesl

Canned Biscuits Q<
Mrs. Wright's T
♦  Sweet Milk or ^Buttermilk —  10-Ct. Coe

Piedmeot Petty

H ighw ay. 
Blck Revoci

5 9 *
k 39<
ty  6 3 * 
x r  3 7 *  

a * 3 5 <  
HA 1 9 *  
£ r  55<

Money-Saving ValuesI

Soft Drinks 7 „ J 1
Cragmont. Asserted. Specia l! £  Betties | ^ B

*Wfcele +SUced 
Greoe Olaet. Sp,r *mi:M u s h r o o m s  

M a r g a r in e  
G e la tin s  
D e ls e y  T is s u e  4  rVM* S i

3«r*l
4 18̂ 1. ( 1

C h it  P M *

1 2  Ss S I

Safeway 
Special!

Corn-on-Cob o js r tz * x r  49< 
French Fries cx t e z * . m  29< 
Cheese Pizza T .m u  it?  67< 
Popsicles (Mwnmn x r  29<

Dairy Low Prices!

Fresh Milk
Lucerne 
Low Fat.

Safeway Big Buy! C arto l

Apple Pie
or ACherry. Bel-air

$Safeway
Special!

24-oz.
Pkgs.

Strawberries
d

$ '

Scotch Treot. Sliced

Safe nay 
Big Buy!

10-ox.
Pkgs.

Compare Froiea 
Food Quality!

Safeway Guarantee* the 
Qaallty The Finest Frod- 
**♦» ya« ca* bay! Vaa will 
Ahd a complete lelectle* 
e f year teaertte Frame 
N ad t at year caaaealaat 
Safeway Star*.

Banquet Dinners 
Bel-air Waffles *
Pound Cake ke re  Lee

Vegetables

Asserted  
H .c e * t  Beef i

SoeA* ly e  Doe.sk Sty le

38<
J*T 10<
z ?  79< 

49*

4
Auerted Spatial l

54
Cottage Cheese
Lccerae. Auerted Style* — 14-ex. Ct* V  w

Bakery Values/

Cinnamon Bread
Mr*. Wright's.
Hot from the Oven 
in 15 Minutes!

Margarine 
Tomato Soup 
Plain Chili 
Salad Oil 
Fish Fillets 
Whole Okra 
Steak N ’  Tater

IBIHlm i  Shop and Savei

Air Freshener

Tew* Heat#. 
Xettyl

Tewh Haem. Spicy!

•a-mada. Co.kl.y 041!

Mr*. Peal* Fried

Saa-Fre.h laby Okra

Di**ar. 
Nlykt Hawk

Glade

Ur fust**

H o n e y s u c k le  W h ite  
S w i f t ’ s  B u tte r b a ll io tTlJu*VI* 
S m o k e d  H a m s  u*unu? 
W h o le  H a m s  .e ttu r e s s . 
F r e s h  P o r k  C h o p s  Family Pock 

S m o k e d  P o r k  C h o p s *c~ x v i*  
F r e s h  P o r k  R o a s t **■*■ 
L e a n  P o r k  S t e a k I F r n h  Fa r*. ( r t t  Cat — U .

Glade.
Assorted Sceets. 
Boom Deodorisar 2 -  $ 1Aerosols

Styla* — '

Safeway Meats Are Guaranteed to Please.

P  Turkeys ac
_I h

10 ta 14-Lh. A v f. Plamp A Taadar L U a  m

Cornish Hens
Rock Gam*. I I  ^  M
USDA Inspected Grada'A’. 20-o*. Six# — loch

B o n e le s s  R o a s tsszrszJtHttX 
E c k r ic h  Sausage■sr&wiss?- 
S lic e d  B a c o n  
S a fe w a y  B a c o n  
R a th  B a c o n  (Tkick-S 

P ik e s  P e a k  R o a s t s  
T o p  S irlo in  S t e a k  
E c k r ic h  F r a n k s  
S lic e d  B o lo g n a

5 9 *
Mini Loaves 4 9 *
M r* . W r i g h t s  A s s o r t e d  — 1-L b  Pk o  ■

1-Lb.
Pkg.

C o ita l Brand 

No. 1 Quality. M eed

Both Black H iw h  
(Thick-Sliced— 2-Lb. Phg * 1.49)

.. O iottom  Found 
BoM ltst. USDA

Choice H eovy I t e f

Cut-Up Fryers 0 0 <
R e q u la r  F r e ik  N o F ia a r  Q u a l it y  A v a i la b l*  m i l  j B  
a t  A a y  P r i c *  . . .  C e m p a r * —  — L b .

t i n  w Alblak 
Safaw ay Jut

x: 89< 
_ u .  75<

B a k in g  C h ic k e n s .’ 
L e g  Q u a r te r s  
B r e a s t Q u a r t e r s  
S p lit B re a s ts  
L a r g e  Fis h  S tic k s  
P e rc h  F ille ts  . . .

Fcotb. 3 fa  3' t-Lb Ava 
SDA lnt» G rade A — Lb

Fre*b C a t Frem  
(erode A Fryer*

Freib Cat from 
Groda A F rye r* — Lb.

W lfb  Bib* Fre th  Cat
Froat Grade A F rye r* — Lb.

Pre-Ceehed — Lb.

H a ir  S p r a y  
V ita m in  ‘ C ’  
M o t o r  O il

Tnrfy Wee. Aooerted

Safaway IBB MO

Teieee *M  Wt. ar *30 1

2 is &  1 1  
3?=r51

Safeway Guaranteed to Please. . .

Beef Rib Steaks Leg of Lamb All Meat Wieners Lean Ground Beef
e” ( . CH .t ,v i Mf — Lb. $1 09
(Short Ribs-tb 49<) X

-u. $t 09
79.) 1 (ArmourStarx : 68<) O J '

Campar* Qaallty. Lb. O  7  1

(Safewayt t o J W )  O f  '

Navel Oranges I Q *
Sunkist. Large Fancy — Lb.

B a n a n a s  2 ib S2 5 <Golden. Large Fruit. Tup Quality m m  ‘•DS> m m

C ris p  C a r r o t s  CrlafTlT Croecky iif. 19 ^ B la c k e y e  P e a s  m a im w  tv,r.39<
R e d  T o m a to e s  isum* ^  39< R u s s e t P o t a t o e s  u ,c , w,.., 5 .;5 5 <
T e x a s  Y a m s  _** 23< R u b y  G r a p e fr u it  2 i«h 29<
Y e llo w  O n io n s  3 £ 3 9 <  D ’ A n jo u  P e a r s  «-aarsj^-- _u 2 9 «

| Variety and Quality!

Potatoes 5* s i * tcte. 25
Bud. AII-Furpo»e Pototoa*

1 0 s 3 »

♦  tad 
Lorge

Lemons

i

Seakiof. Large Slat. Jelcy. Back"3 . 0 ,2 5 ^
Rome Apples W t
US #1. Loro* Stoe —Lb ■ ■  V

Save on Your Favorite Size!

Tide Detergent
.......3 1 'iz Z 'r£ u ....... ‘ 1 * 2 : 1 2

*  : i w . . 7 9 ^ 7 T  ‘ 27 ,2: 22*

Check These Valuesl

C a n n e d  P o p  Seewy Peak Assarted Coo 8<

L iq u id  B le a c h  **» ..* * . nattfl 38<
P a p e r  T o w e ls  ; i c 28<
P a p e r  N a p k in s  v S?’ 1CK

ZJku Week i  Special! 

O A C / U l C l  DINNERWARE

This Week’s 
Feature

Each
WITH EVERY J3.00 PURCHASE

Pricts Effactive February 3-5, in ............... EASTLAND
No Sales to Dealers.

Compere 
& Save! Q  S A F E W A Y

® c o m a  c n t teta iamwav c-oncc >ncoaaoa>



A HALF DOZEN SMILES - - Plenty of pretty, Mrs. L.E. Underwood of 203 S. Walnut St. They are 
sparkling teeth are shown here by children of Mr. and from top left: Chico. 6; top right; Lenaya, 1: middle

Speaker

Mr Gaither Yanderveer 
field representative of La 
Busqueda The Quest i the 
Spanish Radio Ministry of the 

Herald of Truth" will speak at 
the evening services of the 
Plummer and Daugherty Sts 
Church of Christ. Feb 6. at 6 
p m

Mr Vanderveer's report will 
be a general review of the total

ministry of the Herald of Truth 
in the fields of Radio and 
Television E\ angelism He will 
report in detail on i the Quest i 
the Spanish Radio Ministry of 
the Herald of Truth It is a five 

day a week program that 
centers largely on a paragraph 
by paragraph study of the New 
Testament in Spanish The 
program is now aired over 13 
stations in Mexico with 12 more 
to he added as soon as funds are 
available Plans have been laid 
for placing the program on at 
least one station in each of the 
Spanish speaking countries in 
Central and South America by 
1975 Evangelism via radio in 
French and Italian should also 
progress in 1972 

The Plummer and Daughety 
St Church of Christ sponsors 
the Herald of Truth" over 
KERC. Sun'tav morning — 8:30 

9 no a m  The local 
congregation is concerned 
about l,a Busqueda because of 
several years sponsorship of 
evangelistic efforts in Mexico 

The public is invited to be 
present for this interesting 
■•eport

!\t*w Arrival
Mr and Mrs Sidney High of 

Eastland are happy to an­
nounce the birth of their son. 
Richard Allen born Jan 25 in 
Eastland Memorial Hospital 
Richard weighed six pounds, 
three ounces

Maternal grandmother is 
Mrs Luther Ingram of Cisco 
and paternal grandparents are 
Mr and Mrs Tom High of 
Eastland

look who’s new

Mr and Mrs Danny Hobbs 
are happy to announce the birth 
of a son. Kevin Ray. born Jan 
28. at S 15 pm

Mr Hobbs was formerly 
employed by Perry Brothers in 
Eastland He is now with the 
Perry's store in Memphis 
Texas

Kevin has one brother Will
Maternal grandparents are 

Mr and Mrs Sam Collins of 
Gorman and paternal grand­
parents are Mr and Mrs B W 
Hobbs of Carbon

Klatwood HI) 

(Huh Holds Meet

The Flatwood Home 
Demonstration Club met 
Thursday. Jan 27. in the home 
of Mrs M W Grieger with nine 
members present

Roll call was answered with 
"My Recipe for Happiness' and 
Mrs Hastings read the twenty 
third Psalm as tlie devotional 
Mrs Sherrill presided over the 
business meeting and*led the 
opening exercise

Health. Safety , and Cultural 
Arts were selected from a list of 
programs read by the 
president

The club has a project of 
making 4 - H aprons as soon as 
the material and pattern is 
received

Mrs O'Brien led recreation 
and refreshments of cookies, 
chips, coffee, and hot apple 
juice were served by the 
hostess

The next meeting will be Feb 
3rd

NOTICE
D i m * to circumstances beyond our control, we w i l l  be | 

interrupting daytime calble television service intermittently 
during the next three weeks.

lie assured that our interruptions will be held to the \
absolute minimum as we perform maintenance procedures 
to insure your continued good television viewing.

We apologize in advance and feel sure that viewers 
will understand these necessary interruptions.

Sincerely,

John Nevill
Southern Television Systems Inc.

Eastland 629-1 .">80

left: Rocky, 12; middle right, Sandy, 10; bottom, left, 
Dena, 8; bottom right, Bimbo, 3.

HAPPINESS
IS

Attending Bethel 
Baptist Church

A Special Invitation To Attend!
Sunday School 9:4i> a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Training Union 6:00 pan.

Evening Worship 7:00 pan.

Pastor - J. Dway ne Martin

Call for from Dmllvmry
629-2681 103 W. Mom St.

Pioneer Club Enjoys Program

The Pioneer Club enjoyed a 
wonderful day in the home of 
Mrs Lorine Crawford, January 
27 Every way one turned they 
saw the handiwork of their 
hostess Her moat recent ac­
complishment was the piecing, 
putting together of five quilts 
for her grandchildren They 
were ail made by the same 
pattern, “ The Broken Wind­
mill Two of them were for 
single beds, and three for 
double beds Each seam was 
briar stitched with silk thread 
at every seam

Besides that, Mrs. Crawford 
had made two lap robes and 
some throw pillows, all by the 
same pattern.

Mrs Sallie Garrett gave 
thanks before all sat down to a 
mo6t delicious meal, pot luck, 
as always.

There were eleven women 
and two husbands We were 
happy to have two guests with 
us. Mrs JosieTrott of Lubbock 
and Mrs George Olive Heck. 
Eastland

Also a couple of friends who 
were sick had their meal in 
their bedroom They were Mr 
and Mrs Hodge from Lake 
Leon.

New officers were re •

elected for the coming year. 
They were Mmes. Boris 
Crawford - president

Mrs Nina Hastings - vice 
president

Mrs. Sallie Garrett - 
Chaplain

Mrs Alma Castleberry - 
Secretary - treasurer

The next meeting will be in 
the home of Mrs Josie Nix at 
1010 South Seaman. February 
24.

Mrs Nix gave an interesting 
reading entitled "The Seven
Keys".

Those present were Mmes 
Josie Nix, Arie Herring, Fannie 
Lockhart. Fannie Lee Littleton. 
Sallie Garrett, Winnie Bassett, 
JosieTrott, George Olive Heck, 
visitor. Lorine Crawford, 
hostess. Alma Castleberry. Ben 
Bassett, and Pat Crawford

Alma Castleberry 
Secretary

Briefly told

Overnight guests Saturday in 
the home of Mr and Mrs J.C 
Allison were Mrs Allison's 
sisters. Miss Ann Shelburne, 
and Mrs Vera Adams of Fort 
Hancock. Texas

NOTICE
Now open for business 
Tropical Aquarium No. 2

Located - Hillside Apt. No. 3 Unit 21 
Hours 8:1)0 a.ni. to 10:00 p.m.

For all your Tropical fish Needs

come and take a look.

SPECIALS GALORE!

<
♦

I
I
I
♦

70 Ford Torino Cobra
2 Door H.T. Auto Trans.

‘68 Ford Custom
A. P. Steer Low Mileage

‘68 Chevy Pickup - work 

*64 Chevy P  ICKUP -work

- I

I

I
I

| HOOD KING ♦
i M O TO R CO. |
I 100 E. Main Eastland 629-1786 *

EDDIE'S
513 W est Main 

629-8838

OFFERING THE BEST 
IN AUTO SERVICE

Complete Auto tune-up and repair 
Mechanic Vic Edwards

Free Pickup and Delivery 
Guaranteed Service

At Phillips 66
its performance that counts



I 1 f (

r Jack Hetzel, candidate for state representative was speaker for the 
G.O.P. Womens Club.

Those present were - (seated) Lillian and Jack Hetzel and Mrs. Leroy 
Arnold, (standing) Mmes. Boles, and Bulgerin, Mr. and Mrs. Wadley and 
Mrs. Crane.

The next meeting of the G.O.P. Club will be in the apartment of Mrs., 
Leroy Arnold on Feb. 18th.

‘G E T  W E L L , GRAND • DADS’ - - Good • looking 
Shawn Alsup, 6, son of Mr. and Mrs. Herman Alsup 
sends Get • Well Greetings to two grandfathers, Mr . 
Dewey Alsup. a patient at Stephenville Memorial 
Hospital, and to Mr. Andy Taylor, a patient at 
Hendrick Memorial Hospital in Abilene.

Thf original Metropolitan Opera Houw opened in New 
York CMy on Oelober 12, 1MJ.

Tke Nail Swastika flat was made (he official Bat of (he 
Reich on October 23, 1935.

On October 24, 1945, the Cnited Nations charter became 
effective following ratification bv all Kve permanent members 
of the Security Council and 24 other nations.

New York City subway opened on October 25, 1904.
......................................................................... Hill........ ........... ......................... .................................. uni...... .

Now Open 
Squires Enco |

Station
Open 24 Hours

} Intersection of 1-20 & Lake 
Leon Road .I**"1 « f  Eastland

629-8892

V— * Vii#sh Grease 

Alinbr Repairs & Tune-ups 

of all types
We GiveS&H Green Stamps

Jerry Squires, 0ealer

C rossley-Th om pson
After honeymooning in Acapulco, Mexico, Dr. and Mi*. 

Gregory W. Thompson, are now at home in San Antonio, 
Texas, where Dr. Thompson is Interning at Bexar County 

Hospital. They were mimed 
Saturday, January 8, 1972, in 
St. Francis Episcopal Church.

The altar was banked with 
white winter bouquets of 
glad lo las, carnations, and 
mums with jade foliage, and a 
Memory candle, used in 
the ceremony, to create the 
d ecor fo r  the impressive 
d o u b le  r in g  cerem ony.
Adding to the beauty o f the 
decor, the pews were lined 
with aisle candelabra*. In this 
lavish setting, the ceremony 
at seven o ’ c lock  in the 
evening was performed by the 
R e v e r e n d  G .  R i c h a r d  
Wheatcroft and the Reverend 
Monsignor Alfred W. Raye.

* * *

Tuesday, February 8th

EDITIONS
Gift books for 

everyone you know

A Valentine 
for Everyone

^astland Drug

The so lo is t, M ia 
Fi tzgerald who sang the 
“ W e d d i n g  S o n g ’ ’ waa 
accompanied by Mr. Robert 
Lynn at the organ. He also 
provided appropriate musk 
for the wedding.

The bride, who before bar 
marriage was Mias Carole Ann 
Crossley, is the daughter o f 
Mr. and Mis. M. E. Crossley, 
1714. Ronson Road. Dr. 
Thompson is the son o f Mrs. 
Gordon Meeter o f  209 Merrte 
Way, and the late Mr. R. R. 
Thompson.

Escorted to the altar by 
her father, who gave her in 
marriage, the bride chose for 
her wedding an alegant 
formal gown o f ivory silk 
satin combined with French 
lace. Fashioned in the empire 
s i lhouette ,  the moulded 
bodice was designed with a 
sheer yoke enhanced with 
lace appliques and tiny lace 
edging outlining the yoke. 
The high Victorian neckline 
o f lace featured the lace 
edging that also marked the 
high rise waist l ine.  FuD 
bishop sleeves appliqued with 
lace, were caught at the wrists 
with deep cuffs that were 
finished at the hands with the 
l a c e  e d g i n g  t h a t  also 
enhanced the beauty o f  the 
sleeves above the cuffs. The 
ful l  “ A "  l ine skirt was 
embellished with appliques of 
lace and a band o f the lace 
encircled the bottom o f the 
sldrt and around the chapel 
length train.

Her boufffant veil o f silk 
illusion flowed from a Juliet 
Cap o f matching lace and 
cascaded softly to elbow 
l e n g t h .  She  car r i ed  a 
fashionable cascade o f white 
pixie carnations, siephanotis 
and white rose buds with 
green ivy.

The bride's sister, Mrs. Kay 
Rhea, was her matron of 
honor. Bridesmaids were Miss 
K im  Crossley and Miss 
Connie Crossley, sisters o f the 
bride. Mrs. Jody Jonas. Mrs. 
Debbie Peacock and Mrs. 
Paula Courtney.

For her attendants, the 
bride selected floor length

I M p / t o t ©

p y co P w '

A Complete Selection

o f Valentine's
and

Valentine Candy

Prescription
Pharm acy

Telephone 629-1475

East Side of Square

gowns o f  brandy velvet, 
fashioned with fitted bodices 
accented with lace bibs, long 
sleeves with ruffled cuffs of 
lace and soft gathered skirts. 
They each - carried a single 
Tropic ana rose with rose 
foliage and baby’s breath tied 
w i t h  moss green velvet 
ribbon. Complet ing their 
attire, they wore velvet hows 
and baby's breath in their 
hair.

M r. Paul  T h o m p s o n

attended his brother as best 
man, with Dr. Happy Settle, 
Dr. Chip Oawalt, Mr. Pick 
Wi l l i amson ,  Dr. Dennis 
Larson, Mr. Dave Pace and 
Mr. Dick Clardy servings as 
groomsmen. Ushers were Mr. 
Rob Thompson, Mr. Chuck 
Worrell, Mr. Drew Patterson 
and Dr. John Schuesler.

Mrs. Crossley, mother o f 
the bride, wore a floor length 
formal gown o f flowing pink 
chiffon. The groom’s mother 
chose a full skirted floor 
l eng th  gown o f  ye l l ow 
chiffon.

The new Mrs. Thompson, t 
1968 grsduate o f Spring 
Branch Senior High School is 
(ttending the University of 
Texas Nursing School, from

which she will graduate in 
May o f this year 1972. She is 
a member o f Delta Gamma 
Sorority and the rordettes.

Dr. Thompson, a 1963 
graduate o f Memorial Senior 
High School, graduated from 
the University o f Texas in 
1 9 6 7 ,  a n d  f r o m  th e  
University o f Texas Medical 
School in Galveston in 1971. 
He is presently serving his 
internship at Bexar County, 
Hospital, San Antonio where 
he will remain until June, 
then to San Francisco,  
California, where he will do 
his residency in dermatology.

Wh en  the newlyweds  
d e p a r t e d  o n  t h e i r  
honeymoon, Mrs. Thompson 
was wearing a navy, white 
and coral vested suit with 
navy accessories.

Among the honor guests at 
the wedding were the bride’s 
maternal grandparents Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Crowell, and 
her paternal grandmother, 
Mrs. M. E. Crossley, Sr.

Notice

i

the F

This giant snowman greeted County Employees as they came to work
Tuesday morning after a 3 to 4 inch snow fall. The builders were 
unidentified at press time.

Ihursdav. February 3, 19<2

Darla Hammer 
Celebrates 

5th Birthday
Darla Hammer celebrated 

her fifth birthday with a party 
in her home. Tuesday. Jan 25 

A Valentine theme was used 
Refreshments of red and white 
valentine cake, red fruit punch 
and ice cream were served to 
her guests

Par ty  favors given were 
coloring books, bubble gum and 
valentine candy suckers 

Daria's guests were I.isa 
Brinkley. Paula and Sherri

j* The Spot Restaurant j
Featuring

M e x ica n  F o o d
even Tuestiay night

Fresh Water F<at-
every Friday night

The best eating for the whole

Jones. Shirley and John Glenn 
Kidd and Shannon and Tanya 
Caraway

BRIEFLY
TOLD

Irene Petree visited friends 
in East Texas over the 
weekend

I 

I 
<
I 
♦

| ‘ “ ‘ " “ f  i  l i e  d j j u i  • "  — J

j Phone 442-1949 j
| Open 7 a.m. • 9 pan. - 7 (lays a neck j  

^  Mr. and Mrs. titlark's 11 ill. owners |

....................mu.......... mi.... ...................................................

Brinkley, Paula and Sherri !  r  * i • r i u  o  .  •
Boyd Tammie Barron Troy I  f a m i l y  I S  T h e  S p O t  1,1 L l S C O

yjjj/ Model CQ 227W 
22 - inch diagonal

DQCIdZT!

Now's the time to clean out the 
garage and closet and sell your 
don't needs into cash through 
the Classifieds The successful 
businesses use ’em all the 
time- - why shouldn't you1 Up 
to 20 words, one time for gl 50, 
each insertion thereafter forll. 
Keep one running at $8 50 per 
month and change the copy to 
suit your needs Use the 
Telegram Classifieds t- tf.

S s l l

J P ?  „
r B u n d le

Finest,  freshest flowers 
professionally arranged 
in a re usable, satin- 
uhite ceramic container.
A va liable only from your 
F T D  Florist. Just stop 
in or g iie  us a call. VV e  
can send our “ Love- 
Bundle" almost any- 
where in the country.

&
Poe Floral

25th Anniversary
Direct Mailer
S P E C I A L !

(Featured on Page 12 (

BLACK & WHITE CONSOLE TV
• 20,000 volt New Vista chassis
• Twin 6” oval duo - cone Speakers
• Lighted Channel Indicators
• One-set VHF Fine Tuning
• New Vista Power Grid VHF,

Solid State UHF tuners

$2IB
ROBERTSON’S TV

SALES AND SERVICE
609 W Main 629 - 1711
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Thursday, February 3, 1972 Suarez-Brossard Vows 
Read Saturday

Vo Ag Instructor Don Griffin explains how to keep records in the Ag. 
project record book Virgil Fox. a freshman in Eastland High School this 
year is starting on his first project. Each boy in Vo Ag. is required to keep 
a supervised Project Book.

Bennie Coburn Reports for Duty in Saigon
SAIGON U S Naval Forces 

Vietnam! - Petty Officer 
First Class Bennie C Cogburn. 
son of Mr and Mrs Albert W 
Cogburn of 215 S Madera, 
hast land has reported here for 
duty in the Republic of Viet 
nam

He entered the Navy in July 
1958 and is presently serving as 
an advisor to the Vietnamese 
Navy in Saigon

Cogburn will spend his tour in 
Vietnam working himself out of 
a job The l ' S Navy is turning 
over its assets while training 
and advising Vietnamese 
Navymen who are assuming a 
greater role in the defense of 
iheir country

American Navymen work 
closely with their Vietnamese 
counterparts training them in 
the use of complicated craft 
and itjuipment Once the 
Vietnamese sailors develop the 
necessary skills, the craft and 
equipment are turned over to 
their control, effectively 
reducing the number of US 
naval forces needed in Viet­
nam

Another program instituted 
by l T S Navymen to assist the 
Vietnamese in building a more 
viable Navy is called Operation 
Helping Hand Through this 
program American sailors 
strive to offset the war - 
inflated economy and improve 
the austere living conditions of 
Vietnamese Navymen and 
their families through self 
help projects

Vietnamese Navymen are 
taught how to build better 
housing for their families and 
how to supplement their 
meager pay and diet with 
projects such as raising and 
marketing pigs, poultry and 
vegetables

Although this program was 
started by the US Navy, 
concerned civilians have 
stepped in to assist, and it has 
since been chartered in 
Delaware as a tax free foun-

Briefly Told
Mr and Mrs Jack Lee of 1707 

W Commerce had as holiday 
guests in their home their son 
Lanny Lee of San Francisco 
California and Miss Jo Ann 
Haskins of Alameda. Calif 
lanny is Section Supervisor for 
special reports and analysis for 
Pacific Gas and Electric 
Company in San Francisco

Also visiting were their 
daughter Lela and Dale 
Dupree of Houston Lela. a 
senior at Rice University will 
be a candidate for a degree in 
political Science on June 2t>th 
She plans to attend the 
University of Houston this 
summer and attend medical 
school next fall

dation The Helping Hand 
Foundation, at 1100 17th Street 
N W . Washington. D C 20036. 
is managed by American 
businessmen who are donating 
their time and talents to help 
the Vietnamese Navymen 
improve their lives

Miss Irma Suarez and Mr
Harry Bob Brossard were 
united in marriage in a double 
■ ring ceremony Saturday 
evening at the St Francis 
Catholic Church in Eastland 

Miss Suarez is the daughter 
of Mr and Mrs J K Kenshaw 
of Coleman Mr Broussard is 
the son of Mr and Mrs Julien 
Broussard of Port au Prince. 
Haiti

The bride ana groom are

Meeting?
The SO S Club will meet 

Friday Feb 4 at 1 30 p m at 
the First Methodist Church

hLAC kW E LL CLINIC 
In Its New Location

138 B W cwt Rno*ev fit Street 
Gorman. Texa** 764.">4

Announces 
The Association of 

DR. JOSE K. C AM  T. M.D.
In Practice of

Surgery, OB-GYN and G.P.
February 1. 1972 Phone 734-2276

EASTLAND TELEGRAM
used okiminum printing plates 
ideal for roofing, sealing.
Sized 24x36 inches. 25c each 
at the Telegram Office, Eastland

'h W hen You Think of FOOD
THINK OF SLEDGES!

* SLFDGFSi* the only trulv OINE-Stoj 
j  Spot for Lating-A our Table or Ours!
' !n ,[ur retail market, you’ll find the 
freshest, finest ruts of vour choice, 
all guaranteed to please you!

or convenience you 
'an appreciate, shop)

___________ otir r<‘«»d> -to-go dept. V
1 oil can set your table extra-good and 

Vextra-quick with selections from our Q 
}j " ide variety of delicious, fresh items.' 

larhceiif-Beans-Salad* - Ml the fixin* 
And a Complete 

One-Stop Grocery For A on 
Then for Fating-Out Treats: 

v Remember our dining rooms, eon 
i 'enient, delicious and economical. 

Luncheon treats from our wide menu. 
he it barbecue or lighter.

i Anil for that extra-special meal. 
HFMFMBFR SLEDGE S STEAKS.
I he best to start with and cooked thej 

{ *ay  ̂Ol w ant ’em to make your 
; dining out pleasure complete.

II Find It All at SLEDGE'S 
And You'll Like Vi hat You Find

»  s T E D g k s  M a r k e t —

& DINING ROOM
210 S. Lamar 629-2913

Does Your Home Need Insulation?
On Saturday, February 5,

FREEMAN ENTERPRISES
Will be in Eastland to give free estimates 
for Blown Rock Wool Attic Insulation 

During the day call 629-2621 and a salesman will come 
to your home for the free estimate.
Save Money on your Monthly Bills 

and make your home more comfortable.

Blown Insulation

10% Regular Price
If used Saturday, February i>, 1972

• • • • • * • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • '

students at the University of Texas at Arlington Both at- 
Special guests were Mr tended Cisco Junior College 

Broussard's uncle. Dr and Mr Brossard is sponsored to 
Mrs R e n e  Prevost of New York this country from Haiti by Don 
City. Pierson

Brake Shoes, 
Mufflers. H atN 
and Road Service.

Minor
A u to  ‘̂ e^uu.’ux

1 S&H GREEN ST AMPS 
WITH EVERY PURCHASE

LEVENS ENCO
KMI E. Main • Eastland - 629-1688

SUPER SAVE
Goodies

German Sausage
1 2  oz. pkg. 79

^ Decker Quality

♦ Pure Pork Sausage
▼  2  lh .  l u f f  99c2  III. hag

Decker

Hot Links
1 2  oz. pkg.

♦
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦ _______________________\ Fresh t Ground
♦ Chuck
♦ 79c »>•

3 •esh
aif

L iyer
6.>"

Calif. Sunkist
ORANGES

19<Pound

Sweet Crisp
CARROTS
2  291

GOLDEN RIPE

B A N A N A S  /
Pound . >

25° y "
Apples 27>c lb.

ex. Fancy Red Rome

Colo. Russett Potatoes 69‘

Cinnamon Crisps
Keehler^s 1 1 oz. pkg.

Mellorine
Asste'd Flavors V i ual ctn. Bordens

2/89c
♦ Buttermilk
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦ -----------------
♦  VI hite Swan
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦

V i gal. ctn. Bordens

303 can Spinach

White Swan s 303 can. Fruit Cocktail 29‘

♦ white Swan ih oz. can Grape Fruit Juice 3/$l

4

a

White Swan 6 pk. Reg or Buttermilk Biscuits 49‘

J  White Swan Apple Sauce 303 can Apple SaUCe 5/$l

i
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦
♦

Snowdrift 42 oz. can. 82!
Gladiola F l o u r  •> H». hag 59‘

Health t  Seauty 

C O P E  « • » * .  7 9 c
VXINCf IV OOlMM V 0 . .14 9
C O U G H  S Y R U P  ’ I

0 . m a g n e s i a  . .  • / " C

Aids — “
V O S  IO-O i

H A I R  S P R A Y

7 9 (
o im m  i •

t k h m a t k  A D J U S T A B L E  
B A N D

iz  7 9 (
DIOOORANT 4 0 .

H O U R .......H O U R

n o ,  v . i . .  89c

i
f
♦t
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦

♦  
’ ♦  
♦  
♦  
♦

♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦

♦  
♦

♦ 
♦ 
♦
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦

« l o o  ^
♦  
♦

r  /* 100  ♦

♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦  
♦

49
white Swan 303 can Gut Green Beans .ri/, l (M)

5 / f l ow

♦♦

Wish Bone

Italian Dressing ♦
8  oz. bottle |

25c t
♦\
♦
♦
♦

S U P E R  S A V E
*h. 629-1191 400 S S eam an

G.A. W H I T E - M a n a g e r

We Give Geld Bend Stamps ♦
Double Stamps X
Every Wednesday With ^

$2.50 Purchase or more ^
Excluding Cigarettes

4


