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RM ALERT 
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Do you have your place of 
safety picked out in case a storm 
is spotted heading in the direct-
ion of Wheeler? If the answer is 
no, it would be wise to make a 
plan of action if it becomes 
necessary to take shelter. 

Wheeler has been fortunate so 
far this year in not having had a 
cloud which appeared severe 
enough to sound the alert. Each 

Annual Bass 1st 
Fishing Tourney 

aldermen. Bill Owen, right, 
reads the oath to (1 to r) Bob 
Roark, Berniece Hall and Kervin 
Roper, elected to places 5, 3 and 
1 respectively. 

for the protection of your children 
and they are safer at the school 
than in car or on the grounds 
trying to take shelter elsewhere. 
The basement of the gym will 
soon provide room to provide 
shelter for the entire school-
students and facutly. 

Again, you are advised to plan 
now and don't wait until the 
alarm is sounded to look for 
shelter; this plan of action may 
save you life. If the neighbors 
have a cellar; don't be afraid to 
ask permission to use it; time 
spent in the cellar away from TV 
and phones is a good time to get 
to know your neighbor. 

SWORN IN: The Wheeler City 
Council held their regular 
monthly meeting Monday, April 
16. The first order of business 
was the administering of the oath 
of office to the newly elected 

WHEELER TRACK TEAM 
LESSON IN SURVIVAL WINS SECOND IN DISTRICT 

WHEELER TRACK TEAM: The 
Wheeler track team placed sec-
ond in the District track meet. 
Team members are (back row, 1 
to r): Paul Bentley, Ricky Bond, 
Russell Gaines, Benny Baker, Vic 
Bradford, Kevin Andis, Troy 
Callaway and Bobby Jones. 
(Middle row 1 to r): Mike Evans, 
Benny Watson, Mike Gallagher, 
Kyle Lasly, John Harris. Toby 
Bradstreet and Jeff Christner. 
(Front row I to r): Boyd Waldo, 
Roy Gates, Arthur Zepeda, Ty 
Henderson, Bart Mosley. Bret 
Mosley, Rich Brown and Tom 
Childress. 
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High School Track 
Team A Winner 

The Wheeler Key Club will 
hold the first annual Wheeler 
County Bass Fishing Tournament 
The all day event will be Satur-
day, May 5; prizes will be 
awarded for the largest catch-
(total) weight and the largest fish 
(bass) caught. 

Members of the Key Club are 
presently taking $5 entry fees for 
the event. Those registering will 
be allowed to fish anywhere in 
Wheeler County on that date; the 
winners will be determined at 
7:00. The check-in station will be 
located on the north side of the 
courthouse square and will be in 
operation from 2 until 7 p.m. you 
may check in at any time during 
this period. 

To the person with the largest 
catch (total weight in bass) a rod 
and reel will be awarded at the 
close of the activities. A reel will 
be given the person catching the 
largest bass. 

Visitation Dates 
For Kindergarten 
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year the Wheeler Volunteer Fire 
Department divides their men 
into storm watch crews; these 
men go on duty each time 
Wheeler is placed under storm 
alert. The crews position them-
selves at different location 
around Wheeler and watch the 
clouds for threatening condit-
ions. Radio contact with the fire 
station allows the immediate 
sounding of the siren if they feel 
it is necessary. 

The alarm will be sounded 
when the men feel the citizens 
should take shelter. The warn-
ing, as it has been for a number 
of years, will be two 30-second 
blasts of the fire siren; this is not 
to be confused with the fire 
whistle which is a series of 
10-second blasts. (Note: In case 
of fire during severe weather, it 
is the policy to not sound the fire 
siren; the firemen are notified of 
the fire with their individual 
scanners.) In threatening weat-
her, if the alarm sounds, two long 
blasts indicate shelter should be 
taken. 

Where should you go for 
shelter? Storm cellars are all 
over Wheeler; check if the 
neighbors have a cellar and ask 
permission to use it in case of a 
storm. Your second choice would 
be the basement of the court-
house. The south door of the 
courthouse will be open for those 
wishing to take refuge in the 
basement. When the construct-
ion project of the school is 
completed, the basement of the 
gym will be available; at the 
present time, it is a little danger-
ous to try to use this facility. 

If the storm alert sounds 
during school hours, DO NOT GO 
TO THE SCHOOL AFTER YOUR 
CHILD! The school has a plan 

Like an unwanted mother-in-
law, Jim Verden arrived early. 

The unexpected became com-
monplace in the Texas Tech 
football program last year, and 
defensive tackel Verden is char-
acteristic of the positive situat-
ions which resulted in a success-
ful season. 

The 6-3, 240 pound sophomore 
from Wheeler had the physical 
tools to become an excellent 
defensive lineman, but the con-
sensus opinion was that it would 
be at least a year before he 
blossomed and realized his full 
potential. But Verden became 
one of the top defensive lineman 
on the team; however, his past 
gave some indication of that 
occurrence. 

He competed in football, bas-
ketball, and track at Wheeler 
High School, winning the state 
Class B Championship in the shot 
put and discus (he threw the 
discus 183-5 feet to break the 

The Mustang Track Team gave 
Miami a good scare as Miami out 
pointed the young Wheeler team 
140 to 130. With only one race 
left, Miami had a narrow 2 point 
lead. Even though the Mustang 
mile relay team of Boyd Waldo, 
Benny Watson, Kevin Andis and 
Mike Gallagher ran their best 
time of the year, 3:42.6, it was 
only good enough for 3rd place. 
Miami ran a very good 3:33.1 to 
easily win the event and the team 
championship. The Mustangs 
placed people in every event and 
nearly all times were individual 
best for the year, Coach Allen 
stated. In the field events, the 
Mustangs came away with 53 
points compared to 37 points for 
Miami. 
Field Events: 
Shot put - Ricky Bond 3rd - 
40'11 1/4  "-his lifetime best throw. 
Russell Gaines - 40'9" for 4th 

place-lifetime best throw. Jeff 
Christner-6th - 39'2 1/4 ". 
Discus 4th Benny Baker-118'. 
5th - Mike Gallagher - 117'4". 
6th - Ricky Bond - 105'6". 
High Jump - 3rd-Troy Callaway- 

5'8". 
Long Jump - 1st Benny Baker-
20' 1/4  ". 6th Troy Callaway -
18'2". 
Pole Vault - 2nd - Toby Brad-
street - 11'0". 3rd - Mike 
Gallagher - 10'6". 4th - Paul 
Bentley - 10'6". 
440 Relay - 3rd - Arthur Zepeda, 
Boyd Waldo, Bret Mosley and 
Benny Baker 46.7 - best time of 
the year. 
880 yd run - 2nd - Kevin Andis 
2:06.5. 5th Benny Watson -
2:14.6. 
100 yd dash - 4th Mike Gallagher 
- 10.7. 6th - Benny Baker - 10.8. 

440 yd dash - 6th Russell 
Gaines - 54.59. 
120 yd high hurdles - 4th - Kyle 
Lasley 18,58. 
330 yd inter hurdles - 1st Mike 
Gallagher - 41.23. 6th - Kyle 
Lasley 45.61. 
220 yd. Dash - 5th - Boyd Waldo 
24.36. 6th - Bret Mosley 24.61. 
Wheeler Milers placed 2nd, 3rd 
and 4th as expected 2nd - Ty 
Henderson 4:55.64. 3rd - Rich 
Brown 5:05.16. 4th - Bobby 
Jones 5:09.34. 

The Wheeler Mustang Track 
Team has come a long way and 
with no Seniors on the team this 
year, the future for track in 
Wheeler looks very good Coach 
Allen predicts. 

Wheeler had five people to 
qualify for the Regional Track 
meet in Levelland which will be 
held Friday April 27 and 28. The 
qualifiers are Benny Baker in 
long jump, Toby Bradstreet, pole 
vault, Ty Henderson, mile run 
and Kevin Andis 880 yd dash and 
Mike Gallagher 330 yd Inter-
mediate Hurdles. 

Class B record by more than 20 
feet and put the shot 54-41/2  to 
win the state meet by almost 2 
feet.) Verden also played in the 
Texas High School Coaches All-
Star Basketball Game. 

Last season, he missed part of 
spring training, but returned for 
the spring game, and played a 
large part in the White team 
pullin off a 16-0 win. 	His 
importance to the team escalated 
as the season progressed. 

According to Tech coaches, 
Verden has good size, quickness, 
and strength. 	But 	Verden 
states, "It was my size that 
determined my playing football 
in college. I compete in track and 
field now and then, but I don't 
have the size for basketball." 

Attending Tech was almost 
natural for Jim. 

"I lived next door to Don 
Reeves, who played for Tech, 
and my dad wanted me to come 
here," says Verden. "Of all the 
schools that recrutied me, this 
was really the only place. I 
considered attending." 

Verden played in a limited role 
for the varsity as a freshman, and 
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Rites Read For 
"Rusty" Goad 

District Tennis 
Matches Played 

feels he developed most during 
that year. 

"I think I developed most as a 
player during my freshman 
year," says Verden. "I complet-
ed the things that were needed to 
play and grew as far as strength, 
fundamentals, and lateral quick-
ness, which I feel is my major 
asset." 

He is most comfortable at 
defensive tackle, but was tried at 
noseguard last fall. 

During his first season as a 
Red Raider, Verden had to make 
a big adjustment to college ball. 

"There are a lot more quality 
athletes here than in Class B," 
says Verden. "College was a big 
step-I was used to pushing my 
way around, but had to learn 
technique here, which I didn't 
need in high school" 

This will be Jim's second 
spring training, and like most 
players. he thinks only of surviv-
ing it. 

"Spring training is something 
we must go through to get ready 
for the season," says Verden. "I 
didn't come into this spring in 
great shape because I didn't do a 
lot of off season work; so I'll work 
on getting in shape, becoming a 
Netter player, and learning fund-
amentals." 

Verden sees a definite oppor-
tunity for Tech to reach the 
Cotton Bowl this year. 

Continued Page 7 

Sports Banquet 
Tickets On Sale 

to 
TENNIS: Placing in the high Henderson. 	McWhorter and 
school tennis competition last Henderson will compete in Re-
week were (I to r) Phillip Mc- gional competition Thursday and 
Whorter, Myron Jolly and Ty Friday. 

Colts Win 2nd 
In Dist. Track 

'HEADIN' FOR A WEDDIN' " TO 
BE PRESENTED BY EIGHTH GRADE 

District 2B tennis matches 
were played last week and the 
following students came away 
winners: 	Beth Wills, 1st in 
singles. Lori Lee and Missy 
Wiggins, 2nd in doubles. Ty 
Henderson and Phillip 	Mc- 
Whorter, 2nd in doubles. Myron 
Jolly, 3rd in singles. In Junior 
High: Twyla Collins 4th in 
singles. Sherry Shelton and 
Andera McGaughey 4th in dou-
bles. Wade Wills. 3rd in singles. 
Scott Wright, 4th in singles. 

Lance Reames and Mark Moore, 
2nd in doubles. Don Smith and 
Billy Westmoreland, 3rd in dou-
bles. 

The 1st and 2nd place high 
school winners will travel to 

The Eighth Grade Class will 
present "Headin' For a Wed-
din' "-a hillbilly play- on Friday, 
April 20 at 7:00 p.m. in the High 
School Auditorium. Admission 

BOUND FOR REGIONAL: Five 
of Wheeler's track team will be 
participating in the Regional 
Track meet at Levelland Friday, 
April 27 and 28. To qualify the 
tracksters must place first or 
second in district competition. 
Pictured are (1 to r) Mike Gallag-
her, Ty Henderson, Kevin Andis, 
Toby Bradstreet and Benny 
Baker-Foreground. 

Levelland on Wednesday and 
compete in the Regional Tennis 
meet on Thursday and Friday. 
Congratulations to all of these 
fine young people. 

If you have a child who will be 
five on or before September 1, 
1979, they will be eligible to 
attend kindergarten during the 
1979-1980 school year. The week 
of April 30, through May 4, has 
been set for your child and you to 
visit the kindergarten (in the 
multi-purpose room) at Wheeler 
School. The following schedule 
has been arranged but feel free 
to bring you child on another day 
during the week if you cannot 
make it on this day : Last names 
beginning- A,B,C,D,E, Mon., 
April 30-8:30-9:30 a.m., F,G,H, 
I,J, 'Tues. May 1 same time as 
above, K,L,M,N,O, Wed. May 
2 same time as above, P,W,R,S, 
T, Thurs. May 3 same time as 
above, U,V,W,X,Y,Z, Fri., May 
4 same time as above. 

The State of Texas requires 
that your child have MMR shots 
and that his boosters of poio and 
DPT be up to date. The school 
nurse, Sharon Wright will be in 
the kindergarten room each day 
of the visitation to check your 
child's immunization records. so 
please bring your records with 
you. The State of Texas also 
requires that you bring a copy of 
your child's birth certificate 
when you enroll your child. If 
you do not have this you need to 
get a copy before school starts in 
the latter part of August. 

Elementary To 
Have Operetta 

Fans and supporters of 
Wheeler High School athletics 
may purchase tickets for the 
April 30th All Sports Banquet to 
be held in the school cafeteria 
and auditorium. 

Tickets will be $4.00 each and 
people are urged to purchase 
their tickets early so the meal can 
be prepared accordingly. Tickets 
may be purchased at the school 
business office, Baker Auto-
motive, First National Bank and 
Rives Insurance. 

Randy Matson, former olympic 
gold medal winner and now 
employed by Texas A & M 
University, will be the principal 
speaker. 

Kelton Lions To 
Host Rabies Clinic Senior 

Auction 
The Kelton Lions Club in 

cooperation with Dr. Tommie 
Hennard of Wheeler Veterinary 
Clinic will hold a rabies vaccinat-
ion clinic from 2 to 4 P.M. 
Sunday, April 22, 1979 

This will be held at the Kelton 
School bus barn and the vacci-
nation fee will be $4.00. 

Anyone interested in protect-
ing their pets from rabies is 
urged to bring them to the clinic. 

Oshel C. "Rusty" Goad, 65, 
died April, 11, 1979. 

Services were held Friday, 
April 13, 1979 at 2:30 P.M. at 
Wheeler Church of Christ with 
Art Smith and Ernie McGaughey 
officiated. 

Burial was in Wheeler Ceme- 
tery under the direction 	of 
Wright Funeral Home. 

Mr. Goad, born in Gordon, 
moved to Wheeler County with 
his family in 1920. He lived in 
Wheeler most of his life. He was 
a World War II veteran, serving 
in Air Force and Navy. He was 
machinist at Beef Cattle Com-
pany in Wheeler. 

Survivors include three bro-
thers, Jim of Plainview, Evart of 
Pampa and Emmit of Riverside, 
Calif.; four sisters, Mrs. Hattie 
Miller of Bakersfield, Calif., 
Miss Berga Goad of Encino, 
Calif., Mrs. Ardell George of 
Canadian and Mrs. Ruby Zybach 
of Briscoe, and several nieces 
and nephews. 

Pallbearers were: 	Eddie 
George, Carroll Goad, Jimmy Z. 
Goad, Loyd Goad, W. A. Goad, 
Jr.. Doyle Pond, Bob Zybach and 
David Zybach. 

will be $1.00 for adults and $.50 
for students. 

This play deals with a hero 
"Homer Hollowbove, who falls in 
love with a debutante whose 
picture he found in a newspaper 
wrapped around some fish. He 
writes to the girl telling her he 
lives in a huge mansion, and is 
telling her he is very refined. 

He really lives in a shack in the 
mountains. There is a bit of 
feuding, too, but the "happy 
surprise" ending will give you an 
evening full of fun and enter-
tainment. We invite everyone to 
attend. 

Wheeler Junior high boys 
track finished 2nd with 98 points 
behind Follett who had 116 in the 
2B District track meet at Miami. 
Shot put - Wade Wills 2nd. Billy 
Westmoreland - 5th. 
Discus - Wade Wills - 2nd. Billy 
Westmoreland - 6th. 
Pole Vault - Greg Atherton - 4th. 
400 Meter Relay - 1st - Billy 
Westmoreland, Mark Moore, Ja-
mie Porter, Scott Wright. 
600 Meter Dash - 1st - Billy 
Westmoreland. 6th - Sid White-
ley. 
80 Inter. Hurdles - 3rd - Troy 
Stephens. 6th - Bill Watson. 
400 Meter Dash - 4th - Scott 
Wright. 
200 Hurdles - Troy Stephens - 4th 
Jamie Porter - 5th. 
200 Meter Dash - 4th - Mark 
Moore. 6th - Don Smith. 
1200 Meter Run - Ronny Jones -
5th. 
1600 Meter Relay - 1st - Jamie 
Porter, Billy Westmoreland, Don 
Smith, Scott Wright. 

Hrnciars To Give 
Program Thurs. 

Tech Football Is 
Program Topic 

RABIES CLINIC 

The annual Senior Class auc-
tion will be held on april 23rd at 
7:00 p.m. in the Field House 
(formerly the American Legion) 
just north of the school building. 
All donations would be appre-
ciated. As you clean out your 
garages, closets, and attics, just 
call one of the following seniors 
to haul off your junk. Remember 
one persons junk may be 
another's treasure. Auctioneer 
will be Frank Walker. 

Call the following Seniors to 
pick up your donations: Russell 
Miller, 6-5608; David Wright, 
6-5503; Miles Farnsworth, 6-
5932; Marvin Grimes, 6-5835; 
Tom Christner, 6-5742; Rhonda 
Jennings, 6-5559. 

Play Cast 
Back Row left to right- Becky 

Hardcastle-director, Lenna Gar-
ner, Patricia LaForge, Wade 
Wills, Jamie Porter, Twyla Col-
lins. 

AT ALLISON 

An Animal Pet Clinic will be 
held April 29th in the Ag building 
in Allison from 2700 until 4:00. 
Dr. Hennard from Wheeler will 
be present and give the injections 
for $4.00 per net. 

Middle Row left to right- Greg 
Atherton, Tracy Walker, Kelly 
Calloway, Tracy Weaver, Don 
Smith (sound effects)- Chandra 
Crockett. 

Front Row left to tight- Teresa 

The program at Kiwanis Mon-
day April 23, will be highlights of 
the Texas Tech 1978 football 
season. The program will be 
presented by Coach Bob Patter-
son, Texas Tech. 

Martin, Nancy Bradstreet, Mona 
Jennings, Kristi Baker, Scott 
• Snag 

On Friday, April 27. at 7:00 
p.m. the Wheeler Elementary 
music classes grades K thru 4, 
will present Frederick, an oper-
etta taken from Leo Lionnes 
book, Frederick. The production 
features an original music score 
and oustanding performances by 
Augie Hennard, who portrays 
Frederick, and Eric Price, Brid-
gett Wallace, Tammy Baker, and 
Tina Alvey who play his field 
mice family. The narrator is 
Bobby Sword and the stage crew 
includes Rodney Bond, Carl 
Knutson, Jimmy Sides and Dar- 
ryl King. 	The kindergarten 
children will be snowflakes, the 
1st graders play rays of the sun, 
the boys and girls in the 2nd grad 
represent colors, the 3rd grade 
class portrays silly cats, and the 
4th grade students are the four 
seasons. Be sure to be at the 
Wheeler School Auditorium on 
Friday, April 27 at 7:00 p.m. for 
Frederick. A delightful evening 
of entertainment will be your 
reward. 

TENNIS ANYONE: These young 
lathes will give you a game. They 
place first and second in district 
competition last week. 	Beth 
Wills took first place honors in 
singles play and Lori Lee and 
Missy Wiggins placed second in 
doubles play. 	They will be 
representing Wheeler at Region-
al this weekend. 

The date for this program 
given by Mr. John Hrnciar of 
Shamrock will be April 26 at 7:30 
P.M. in the Briscoe school audit-
orium. The Briscoe extention 
Homemakers Club and Briscoe 
P.T.A. will sponsor the program. 
Ther will be slides shown also. 
Everyone is welcome, come. No 
charges, refreshments will be 
served by club members. 
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Ontsilitsts 

Save 
for the expected 

and... 

the 
unexpected 

MUlti HOUSING 
KLENDEII 

SERVING THIS AREA SINCE 1934 

"We lost oar Homer 

Perhaps the first life insurance 
to buy is 'mortgage redempt-
ion', which pays the mortgage 
balance if the head of family 
dies. A debt-free home is a 
blessing for the surviving 
family. The Rives Insurance 
Agency offers mortgage life 
insurance. 

RIVES 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
115 W. Texas-826-5224 or 826-5202 

Citation 4-Door Hatchback 

EPA 
ESTIMATED 

MPG 

CITY 
ESTIMATE 24 

38 HIGHWAY ESTIMATE 

With standard 4-cylinder engine 
and manual transmission 
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Channing with Mr. and Mrs. 
Normal Dyer and Betty Ann. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Miller were 
dinner guests in the Hiram 

a I Albion newi 
Mrs. Lester Levitt 

Word was received last week 
of the death of Sherman Giddens 
who lived at Perry, Arkansas. 
The nieces and nephews here 
are, Mrs. John Gilmer, Mrs. 
Wilma Gilmer and Carl and Ray 
Giddens. They were unable to 
'Mend the funeral. 

Mr. and Mrs. Percy Minard 
from Reydon. Oklahoma visited 
ter cousin Mrs. Pearl Harrison 
Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Lee 
Sanford from Sinnett were over 
night guests in the Clifton Boyd- 

Dr. M. V. Cobb 
CHIROPRACTOR 
Specializing in The 

Examination And 
Treatment of Spinal 

4nd Nervous Disorders 

256-2133 

310 South Main 
SHAMROCK, TEXAS 

• 

Towusley at the Ag-building in 
Cheyenne Okla. Saturday. 

Dr. Willis Harrison and family 
from Canyon, Darrel Harrisons 
and Casey Hensons from Amar-
illo, Clifton Boydstons, Rev. Vir-
gil Cornwell and family, Nettie 
Walsh and Vivian Wallace were 
guests in the Bruce Harrison 
home over the weekend. 

Stanley Swires and family from 
Reydon visited Doris 'Newsom 
Sunday. 

Dinner guests in the Roy 
Morse home Sunday were: Dick 
Green and family, Vauce Boyd-
ston and family and Ronnie 
Chapman and family from Bor-
ger. 

Whitner home in Wheeler Sun-
day. Kelly Miller and family 
from Houghton Kansas met them 
there. Mr. and Mrs. Hiram 
Begert and Bret spent Sunday in 
Erick Oklahoma with Mrs. Lolet-
ta West. 

Verne and Susie Lohberger 
John D. and Iris Ghsau and Nova 
Pawledge visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Kiker Friday. 

Bruce Harrisons Opal and 
Juanita Boydston, Nettie Walsh, 
Maudie Harrison, Rev. Virgil 
Cornwell and family, Clifton 
Boydstons and Lesa Craig at-
tended 50th Wedding Anniver-
sary of Mr. and Mrs. Lee 

Becky Zybach returned home 
Thursday from Parkview hospital 
in Wheeler where she spent a 
week for treatment. She had to 
return to the hospital Sunday 
evening. 

Mrs. Pondexter and Mrs. Long 
from Cheyenne, Okla. Linnie 
Lewis from Crawford, Okla and 
Mrs. Ona Black were dinner 
guests in the home of Nettie 
Walsh Sunday. 

An Animal Pet Clinic will be 
held April 29th in the Ag building 

prton home Tuesday of last week. 
t Lee Kiker received word last 
neek that his brother Asberry 
Llter who resided at Weslaco, 
tsear McAllen, passed away after 
a lingering illness with cancer. 
Mrs. Kiker is the former Gladys 
Kiker, early residents of Old 
Zybach. 

TELEPHONE 

826 3078 

[ROGUE THEATRE 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 Popcorn Special! 

Richard Nall, Manager 

ONE WEEK April 20-26 
Showtime: 8:00 P.M. 

"It may be the best movie 
of its kind ever made:' 

imastionat 
Body 

• 
POI 

here from 2:00 until 4:00. Dr. 
Hennard from Wheeler will be 
present and give the injections 
for $4.00 per pet. 

Mrs. Bessie Giddens was a 
patient in the General hospital in 
Shamrock last week for treat-
ment. She is home and feeling 
much better. 

Mr. and Mrs. Verne Lohberger 
accompanied by Mrs. LaVerne 
Scribner of Mobeetie, attended 
the 50th wedding anniversary of 
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Davis at 
Dumas Saturday and were dinner 
guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Beck. 

Mrs. Pete Gilmer, Becky and 
Jeanne and Mrs. Keith Boydston 
spent the weekend at Denton, 
Texas with Miss Linda Kay 
Gilmer who is employed there. 

Dan-el Harrison from Amarillo 
was an over night guest in the J. 
D. Wallace home Saturday. 

Keith and Forrest Glen Boyd-
ston, Pet Gilmer and Ray Hend-
rix from Perryton are at Port 
Isabel this week fishing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Helm from 
Sacramento, California were 
house guests in the Edyth Don-
aldson home Monday. They plan 
to move soon to this area. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Montgo-
mery from Lubbock visited in the 
parental Clifton Boydston home 
Sunday. 

Mrs. Jane Dupont entered the 
Parkview hospital in Wheeler 
Sunday night for treatment. 

FIRST FEDERAL 

Receive 
a 
cone 
of fresh 
hot Popcorn 
at no extra charge with the pure's-  se 

Dinner guests in the Edyth 
Donaldson home Sunday were: 
Johnny Donaldson, Mr. and Mrs. 
David Lewis and son from Well-
ington, Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Donaldson from Canyon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Whitten and Scotty 
from Amarillo, Roland Morse, 
and family from Dumas, Colie 
Donaldson and family from Bor-
ger, Mr. and Mrs. Lee Richard-
son from Stinnett. Other guests 
or Sunday were: Stanley Swires 
and family from Reydon Okla., 
Doris Newsom, Dean Lieb and 
family from Pringle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ruben May, and Edwin 
Begert and family from Amarillo, 
and Bill Donaldson and family. 

Lee Halls were dinner guests 
in the Lloyd Jones home Sunday. 
In the afternoon the two families 
visited Terry Jones and family in 
Harold Jones home at Wheeler 

Easter guests in the Zeland 
Rainey home were: George and 
Avis Parker, Mike Dyer and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Les Seam-
ster, Mr. and Mrs. Winston 
Rainey, Kenneth Ray Hammons 
from Pampa, Alana Daughtry 
and sons and Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Hamon from Wheeler. 

David Zybach and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Garland Dukes 
were Sunday dinner guests in the 
Joe Dukes home, 

Red and Anna Dukes spent the 
weekend at Whiteface, Tex. with 
Tommy Hayes and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Duane Childress 
and Mr. and Mrs. Randy Taylor 
from Wheeler were house guests 
in the Shot Childress home 
Sunday. 

Dinner guests in the Richard 
Kiker home Easter Sunday were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Nachlinger 
from Pampa, Garland Rogers and 
family from Canadian, Mrs. 
Martha Aldridge from McLain, 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenny Nachlinger 
from Amarillo, C. E. Aldridge 
from McLain and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Kiker. 

Mike Dyer and family spent 
from Thursday until Saturday in 

of a medium or large size 1,72 rip. 

O iL19 gr lag 
...Two handsfull of fun! 

I 

Wil-Mart, Inc. Highways 152 & 83 

Wheeler, Texas 

Open 6 a.m. to Midnight Mrs. Mitchell Is 
Club Hostess 

for People on the go! 

First Federal Savings S Loan will help you choose from their lamlly of sayings plans the 
one right for your own family's special needs. 

4k 

ENGAGEMENT 
ANNOUNCEMENT 

Rev. and Mrs. R. C. Van 
Amber of Harrisburg, Ark., an-
nounce the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Deborah Ann, 	to 
Johny rick Helton of Pampa, 
Texas. 

The bride-elect is a 1978 
graduate of Milton High School, 
Milton, Florida, and she is 
currently employed at the First 
Assembly Day Center in Harris-
burg, Ark. 

Mr. Helton is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Melvin L. Helton 
Daingerfield, Texas and the 
grandson of Mrs. John R. Ellison 
Daingerfield, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Helton, Wheeler, Texas. 
A 1973 graduate of Briscoe High 
School, Briscoe, Texas. He 
attended the University of Texas 
in Arlington. He is currently 
employed by Wagner Well Ser-
vice of Pampa, Texas. 

The spring wedding will take 
place at the Southview Assembly 
of God Church in Joplin, Mis-
souri, on May 12 at 7;00 P.M. 

The couple will reside at 1334 
N. Coffee Nol 1 in Pampa, Texas 

Savinsi 	otoan _Alddociation 

P.O. BOX 709 — CHILDRESS, TEXAS 79201(817)937-2514 
BRANCH OFFICES 

MEMPHIS 	WELLINGTON 

TO WHEELER INDEPENDENT 
SCHOOL DISTRICT TAX PAYERS: 

H t,E.3c SAD E.C:1,)! 	N, 

notice is hereh- riven that Iersons who own their re- 
sidential Hmestead ma" appl7 for the Homestead Ex-

emptinn in the amount of :,;5,000.00 off of the Larket 

Value 1w  sichirp an Affadavit at the ffice of the 

ax Assessor-Collector prior ti Fa- 30th., 1979. 

The owner must swear and affirm that the property was 

his- nr her Residential Homestead on January 1, 1979, 

and that he or -she has not claimed Homestead Exemption 

on anv other property. An': Persnn who makes a false 

affidavit shall be suhject to the perjury laws of the 

State ^f lexas. 

Wheeler J.S.D. 

(-)x 1010 

Meeler, Texas 79096 

Phone: (806) 826-5224 

Chevrolet's fiti1 economy car of the 'lips. 

CHEVY 
CITATI 

The Wednesday Study Club 
met April 11, 1979 in the home of 
Mrs. W. D. Mitchell with Mrs. 
Fred Wood as co-hostess. 

President, Mrs. Harold Nash 
called the meeting to order, Mrs. 
R. William Brown and Mrs. 
Harry Wofford reported on the 
Top of Texas District Convention 
at Dumas April 6th and 7th. The 
club won 2nd on the club year 
book—we competed with 66 
other clubs. Four other awards 
were won, two on poetry by Mrs. 
R. William Brown and 2 on 
programs given. 

Program director was Mrs. Lee 
Guthrie. She introduced our 
guest Mrs. Harold Loyd Lee who 
played and sang "I Walked 
Today Where Jesus Walked." 
Next Rev. and Mrs. Ernest 
McGaughey were introduced and 
showed a slide presentation on 
"Our Visit to the Holy Land." 
They visited the Holy Land last 
summer. A very interesting 
story and pictures were given by 
both of them. 

The club closed with a beauti-
ful Prayer given by Mrs. M. 
Mcllahny. 

Delicious refreshments were 
served to 4 guests, Mrs. Harold 
L. Lee, Rev. and Mrs. Ernest 
McGaughey, Miss Marilyn Nash 
and the following members: Mrs. 
Harold Nash, Mrs. M. Mcllhany, 
Mrs. Harold Hill, Mrs. Hoy 
Hunter, Mrs. W. A. Finsterwald, 
Mrs. Harry Wofford, Mrs. R. 
William Brown, Mrs. Lee Guth-
rie, Mrs. George Weems, Mrs. 
Fred Wood and the hostess Mrs. 
W. D. Mitchell. 

Senior Citizens 
Meet Monday 

SHOWDAY: 
FRIDAY, APRIL 19, 1979 

Citation goes a long way on 
a tank of gas. But that's just 
the start. Citation has the 
traction of front wheel drive, 
rack-and-pinion steering, front 
disc brakes, and a transverse-
mounted engine that's cradled 
in rubber-cushioned mountings 
to reduce engine vibration. 
Sleek Citation is easy to park, 
yet big enough for five adults 
and lots of cargo. See Chevy 
Citation for yourself. And to 
really appreciate it, get 
behind the wheel. 

Remember:  Compare the 
estimated  MPG to the 
"estimated MPG" of other 

cars. You may get different 
mileage depending on your 
speed, trip length, and weather. 
Your actual mileage will be 
lower in heavy city traffic, and 
your actual highway mileage 
will probably be less than the 
estimated highway fuel 
economy. The "estimated 
MPG" is more likely to reflect 
actual overall mileage than 
the "combined estimate". 

Chevrolet cars are equipped 
with GM-built engines 
produced by various divisions. 

TEST DRIVE THE ALL NEW CHEW CITATION. 

His phone is ringing. 
Unfortunately it's ringing in the living room. 

The Wheeler Senior Citizens 
met at the Nicholson Building for 
the regular game night Monday 
April 16, 1979 at 6:00 with 13 
members present. Two tables of 
88 had a very enjoyable evening 
with the following persons in 
attendence: Mrs. Laura Guthrie, 
Coordinator, Mary Finsterwald, 
President and members, Rozena 
Horn, Ina Mae Brotherton, Clau-
di Brotherton, Cordie Shumate 
and Paul Shumate, Nolia West-
moreland, Ida Farmer, Mrs. 
Burks, Mrs. Davidson, Fannie 
Mae Bradstreet and Sallie Har-
ris. 

The next meeting will be the 
covered dish supper on Monday 
May 7, 1979 at 6:00 o'clock. 
Come and enjoy a sumptious 
meal, a program and fun with the 
game session, 

14EB61
II  WARE CHEVROLET CO. 

117 W. OKLAHOMA WHEELER, TEXAS 

Extension phones are a conve- 
nience you deserve and they're not ex-
pensive. Just a few dollars per month 
and think of all the legwork they'll 
save you. 

You can't be in two places at 
once. But your phone con. 

If he hod on extension in his work-
room, he wouldn't hove to work so hard 
to get to it. 

General Telephone offers exten-
sions in a wide range of styles and 
colors. And each and every phone is 
backed by all our years of experience. People have believed that 

diamonds can only be found 
at night. © EXTENSION PHONES 



Mobeetie Saw 
& Lock Shop 
SAW SHARPENING 

LOCKSMITHING 

Phone: 845-2353 

R. St. John 
Mobeetie 

LEWALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY.  

ALL•LINES 

r

CAMBRIDGE OR MARIA GRANDE ELEGANT 

DINNER KNIFE EACH 
33c 

KING JAMES VERSION OF THE NEW TESTAMENT 

VOLUME NO. 2 
$ 	29 WITH 53.00 

EACH 	 PURCHASE 

,.•-- us 
*CRISCO 

'PURE VEGETABLE 
SHORTENING 

C-AN

L.  $ 7  

LB. 

cc El EC.-REG - 
DRIP-FINE 

.  FOLGER'S 

COFFEE 

22 9 
1 LB. 
CAN 

• .411-A • a 
'WARS 
POSTERS 

smIL-----(171-1=  FREE+  vsai 
/4 as

itl 
WHEN YOU BUY 

TWO OF THESE CEREALS 
SEE DISPLAY AT YOUR STORE 

Goldert'Aciel 
-Golden ACreS" .s a brand name registered by Taylor Evans Seed Company. Tuba .  

Tens 79088 "T E-  names or numbers are variety designations 

HYBRID GRAIN SORGHUM 
GREENBUG RESISTANT EARLY YELLOW 

Y-45 
• Matures in 90-95 Days 
• Open Head 
• Uniform Height 

• Good Yielder for Maturity Range 
• Excellent Exsertion, Easy Thresher 
• Rigid Stalk, Good Standability 
• Excellent Greenbug Resistance 

WE RECOMMEND TE Y-45 

Wheeler Co-op 
FAR MLA NO /A/int/9 TA/ES INC 

COME IN NOW FOR YOUR SEED NEEDS 

r 

L 

MOIST & CHUNKY 

DOG FOOD 

sib. 	 99

$  Bag 

ic-esdAt:arwrcrt:_ -aAw" -.Y...4a62rLNNEEPaatalan- PEITIWeACCREIMASSIMINIM 
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BETA SIGMA PHI 48th ANNIVERSARY interests of its members, 
When Beta Sigma Phi events 

or civic endeavors are larger than 
one chapter can plan alone,rea  all 
chapters in a city or 

a 
 

Homemakers Sponsor Seminar combine their strength. There 
are state conventions each year 
which any member my attend. 

Internationally, the chapters 
have created several special 

funds: The International Loan 
Fund, through which members 
help one another; The Inter-
national Endowment Fund, 
Which has donated over one 
million dollars to cancer re-
search, cystic fibrosis, homes for 
under-privileged children, and 
many other causes: The Exem-
plar Fund, which helps to sup-
port Literacy Village in India; and 
a college scholarship fund for 
members or their sons or daugh-
ters 

The Xi Upsilon Eta Chapter in 
Wheeler will have it's Founder's 
Day Celebration on Tues. April 
24 at the Methodist Church in 
Wheeler. 

Beta Sigma Phi, a social, for women, plans the celebration 
cultural and service organization of the 48th anniversary of its 

the 30 countries in which the 
organization's 250,000 members 
in over 12.000 chapters exist. 
The organization is non-academ-
ic, non-political and non-sectar-
ian. The keynote to Beta Sigma 
Phi is friendship. 

Chapters of five different de-
grees meet the growing needs of 
various age groups. Members 
are active in small chapter 
groups. Each chapter adapts the 
plans for social, civic, and service 
and cultural activities to fit the 

The Texas Extension Home- from Amarillo, and Mr. Bruce 
makers Association of Wheeler Jordan, director of the Panhandle 
County's Council, Family Living Division of the Arthritis Foun-
Committee sponsored a Arthritis dation. 
Seminar, Thursday, April 5, 1979 	This Public Service Program, 
at 7:30 p.m. in the First United was presented by the Panhandle 

Methodist Church Fellowship Division of the Arthritis Founda- 
Hall, in Shamrock, Texas. 	tion West Texas Chapter, featur- 

Mrs. Faye Martin, Health ing Dr. Charles Seward on Rheu-
Chairman, presented the open- matolagy and Connective Tissue 
ing remarks, and general intro- Diseases. Dr. Kenneth Johnston 
ductions. 	Mrs. Martin stated on Orthopedic Surgery, and Sur- 
the State TEHA Heath Commit- gical Management of Arthritis. 
tee stressed teh #1 Health rec- Dr. John Kelleher on Hand 

_commendation for TEHA Clubs. Surgery. Mr. Jim Keister, Chief 
was the "Study of Arthritis". 	Physical Therapist, St. Ant- 
She extended her gratitude to the hony's Hospital, Amarillo, spoke 
TEHA Advisor, Mrs. Linda Dau- on the role of physical therapy in 
ghtry, County Extension Agent; the management of Arthritis. 
County Council, and County Ex- Mr. Bruce Jordan, ran the pro-
tension Homemakers clubs for jector for the slide presentation 
their help in sponsoring this for each of the speakers. 
presentation. Mrs. Martin intro- 	During the closing remarks 

may founding. 
Beta Sigma Phi is the largest 

women's sorority in the world. 
Celebrations will take place in 

THANKS TO ALL WHO 
HELPED 

Thanks to all the people who 
helped with the egg hunt. 
Especially all of those who do-
nated their time and energy. 
Thanks to all the merchants and 
indivduals who donated prize 
eggs. 

845-2951 
In STATE BIT BL/4, 

1101111/TIE.TEX. 

826-5719 
114 TESAS S-

W HEELER ,T Local Sorority 
Makes Donation 

Lyndon & Noyeline Loyd 
• 

The Xi Upsilon Eta Chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi has made a 
donation of $70.00 to the tornado 
disaster victims in the Wichita 
Falls and Vernon area. 	Xi 
Upsilon Eta was advised that 
much has been donated in the 
way of clothing, food, furniture, 
etc. The donation was sent to the 
Bank of the Southwest in Amaril-
lo where a fund has been 
established. 	Other clubs or 
organizations interested in do-
nating money to this cause can 
mail their checks to: The Bank of 
the Southwest, Wichita Falls 
Disaster Fund, Box 3370, Amar-
illo, Texas, 79106. Attention 
Virginia Curd. 

LAKESIDE GREENHOUSE 
duced Dr. D. 
Shamrock local 
introduced the 

E. Blacketter, 
Physician, who 
visiting doctors 

Mrs. Martin thanked the speak-
ers for donating their time and 
knowledge for coming to Sham-
rock and presenting this infor-
mative program on this timely 
topic which affects so many 
today. Arthitis is a painful and 
sometime crippling disease that 
can be controlled is under proper 
medical care. 

Refreshments were served by 
the Wheeler County TEHA 
Clubs, under the direction of 
Mrs. Emma Rogers, during a 
short intermission. There were 
one hundred forty nine in attend-
ance. 

WE NOW HAVE . 
BERRY VINES 
RHUBARB 
ASPARAGUS 
6A7:DEN 

FRUIT TREES 
SHADE TREES 
SHRUBS 
ROSES 
GRAPEVWES 
VEGETABLES and FLOWERS 

FIT FOR YOUR FEET 
AND FIT FOR YOUR JOB! 

AAA AA A BCD E EE EEE 
1014 9-15 8.15 7.16 7.14 4-16 51:315 6.14 7-14 

SIZES 

RED WING 
15 Miles East, 4 North and 

li East of Viheeler 
OPEN ANY HOUR  Azfeat57-2459 

.0FAVAVairriVr Srafet 
4 

THRIFTY MUM IS 
OIfT PICKNIG W 

SPECIALS FOR 
TNRIETWAYS 

SPRING SALE! 
Farmer Hosts 
Progressive Club 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO LIMIT The club collect was the pro-

gram theme of the Progressive 
Study Club which met in the 
home of Ida Farmer, April 5. 

llla Byers gave a brief history 
about the Collect and a Biograp-
hicol Sketch of the author, Mary 
Stewart. 

The eight parts were explained 
by Novella VanPool, Ruby Lee 
Sandifer, Curtis Moore, Irma 
Kirk, Zinnie Bailey, Ida Farmer, 
Amelia Sims, and Leola Farris. 

Delicious refreshments were 
served after the conclusion of the 
business meeting. Those at-
tending were: Ruby Lee Sandi-
fer, Leola Farris, Pauline Hefley, 

WILSON'S CERTIFIED 

29 SLICED portrait 
oonank5.  BACO N 

YOUR THRIFTWAY STORES 
2U t RAMIE °PRY FINE 

QUALITY ANIBICAN 
GROWNGU/II FED KU. 

RUSH PORK IL 
QUALITY KUM I 

1 LB. 
PKG. 

8 x 10 
NATURAL COLOR 

PORTRAIT 
STATE FAIR BRAND 6 PACK 

CORN DOGS 	 
STATE FAIR BRAND CHEESE 6 PACK 

CORN DOGS 	151/2  O 
PKG.

Z  

FRYER PARTS CUT-UP PAN READY 

FRYERS 	 LB. 69c  
is% oz 	11 59 

PKG.  
$ 11 09 

	 LB 89c  

THIGHS 	 
SELECT SLICED 

BEEF LIVER 
RAMIREZ FRESH CORN 

TORTILLAS 	 

FRYER SPLIT

ASTS 	 LB 
$ 1 19 

FRYER PARTS 

DRUMSTICKS 

9 69 
Curtis Moore, Novella VanPool, 
Irma Kirk, Zinnie Bailey, Illa 
Byers, Mildred Porter and hos-
tess Ida Farmer. 99e 	 GLOVER'S FRESH 

IN.  69c  HOT LINKS 19 $109 
LB. 	• 	 LB. 

DAIRY VALUES FROZEN FOODS plus 50C handling 

MORTON FROZEN 

HONEY BUNS 	BOX 
9 OZ 59 KRAFT CHEESE FOOD 

269  
2 LB. 

. BOx VELVEETA 
MORTON'S BEEFiCHICKEN/TURKEY 

POT PIES 	3 BOXES 89c  
KRAFT SINGLES 

LIGHT-NAIVELY 
KRAFT STACK PACK SINGLES 

$139 • Olan Mills uses Kodak paper • 

Limit: One special otter per 

family every 90 days • Cannot be 

used with Olan Mills Club Plans 

or other advertising offers. 

12 OZ. 
	 PKG.  

PATIO BM OR CHEESE ENCH./MEX.111ESTA/COMB. 

DINNERS 	  EACH 69c  
9 69 

AMERICAN 	  KG 
1
P  
6 OZ 

FREE _
1 TONY'S PIZZA 

With the Purchas of 

3 	
Hamburger Cheese 

PIZZA') Sausage Pepperoni PIZZA'S 

SOFT PARKAY 

MARGARINE 	
2B-80WOL7s  69c Come early and bring this ad to: 

KLEENEX DAYTIME SUPER DRY 

Honey Inn 
Wed., April 19 

1-8 P.M. 

24 CT $249  
BOX 

1607 49 
CAN 

DIAPERS 	 
SHURFINE YELLOW CLING HALVES;SLICES 

PEACHES 	 
DEL MONTE 

SPINACH 1507.39 
	 CAN ENGAGEMENT 

Mr. and Mrs. John Micka, 
Miami, Okla., announce the en-
gagement and approaching mar-
riage of their daughter, Pualette, 
to Ken Austin, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Austin of Wheeler, 
Texas. Paulette is a graduate of 
Northeastern Okla. A. & M and 
is employed at Osborn Rexall in 
Miami. Ken is a graduate of 
Southwestern Okla State School 
of Pharmacy and is a pharmacist 
at Osborn Rexall. A May 5 
wedding is planned. 

LARGE SIZE CALIFORINA HAAS NEW DISHWASHING 

DERMASSAGE 5 6  
M LIQUID 'It AVOCADOS 

$100 

FOR I 

No Extra Charge 
for Groups 

GLADIOLA 

FLOUR B
5 lb. 

ag 

rj

Kodak paper 
Fora good look 
	 at the times of your We. 

HUNT'S 

TOMATO 6 
SAUCE 

CHOCOLATE OR STRAWBERRY CEREAL 

25c  CRAZY COW 	 Z 
'BOX 

CALIFORNIA PURPLE TOPS 

TURNIPS 	 LB .  

CELLO PKGS. FLORIDA 

RADISHES .... ..ZPKGS 

FLORIDA RUBY RED 9 09 
LB 25c  

U349c  

GRAPEFRUIT 	 

Wag 	 
8 oz . 
Cans 

GENERAL

lMILLS 29c 
T 

CEREAL 
9 09 12 OZ. 

	 BOX 

WASHINGTON RED DELICOUS 

APPLES 	 LB. 49c  

NEW CROP EXTRA FANCY ma 	GENERAL

FR 

 MILLS CEREAL 

374 	ANKEN BERRY10 909 CAMPBELL'S 
CREAM of MUSHROOM 

SOUP 
OKRA 	 LB 

5 CRUNCHY OR SMOOTH SHURFINE 
C I  

18 OZ. 89  
JAR 

Cans SHURFINE 
CRUNCHY 
(CREAMY PEANUT B UTTER 

HUNT'S
W 

 

TOMATOES

LE  

i 	1Cons9  84 
VAN CAMP'S 

UAW  ;PORK: 	& BEANS 3 r4,&,?0 89c Van VanE3m 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AID SAVINGS SPRING CLEANING AIDS 

20' OFF LABEL NORMALYOILY/DRY 

BODY SHAmP®  
ON TAP BR

7 OZ. 
. 

25` OFF LABEL 

MR. CLEAN 

28 OZ. 
BTL. 

$ 1 19 

3' OFF LABEL COMET 

R•M• S 29 
20 CT  

BTL. 

1/2  OZ. 
$ 1 09 

BTL. 

‘: 
$ 1 19 
OZ. 

 

BR. 

COLD MEDICINE NIGHTIME 

REGULAR SPRAY 

SINEX 
SPRAY 

- 20 OFF REG:UNSCENT.OUICK DRY 

BAN 
Ty: 
S ROLL-ON 1 5 OZ. 

BTL. 
25` OFF LABEL 

SPIC & SPAN 

GIANT 
BOX 

9  47 
LONG ACTION 

INEX 
PRAY 

20' OFF LABEL HAIR GROOM a  

VITALIS )  49 
7 OZ. 
BTL. 

Ow Mem 
sale •••••••aa 

20' OFF LABEL PINE FOREST LIQUID REG./SUPER HOLD VITALIS 1  09 AJAX $ 09 

CLEANER 29 02. 
 

59 
10 OZ. 

BTL.  

HUNT'S 

11  CATSUP 	 
L 

20' OFF 
LABEL HAIR 

SPRAY CAN 

NICK'S 
NYQUIL 9c 32 oz. 

Jar 

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS PRICES EFFECTIVE APRIL 19.21, 1979 



FOR SALE: 1972 Honcl 
Very good condition. Phone:) 

	  

m7 00n.e:  1 

 LEGAL NOTICE  
826-3221 after 5:30 

	1 p.m. rtn 

k 	 

HOUSES FOR SALE • 

FOR SALE: Newly re-modled, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, w/basement. 
Call 826-5202 or 826-3283. 	rtn 

dants and the legal represen-
tatives of the said unknown heirs 
if they be deceased; and the 
unknown heirs of the unknown 
heirs of each of said named 
Defendants and if they be de-
ceased, their legal representa-
tives, as Defendants. 
The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit: 

A trespass to try title suit in 
which - the Plaintiffs, tor cause of 
action, will respectfully show the 
Court that on or about the 15th 
day of January, 1979, they were 
lawfully seized and possessed in 
fee simple of the following de-
scribed property, towit: 

All of the South Half (S/2) and 
the Northwest Quarter (NW/4) of 
Section 4, in Block A-5, Certifi- 

cate No. 14/2896, H. &. G. N. 
Ry. Co. Survey, Wheeler County, 
Texas, being also described as 
follows in Patent No. 36, Vol. 56, 
dated June 26, 1918, to-wit: 

"In Wheeler County, known as 
S. 1/2 & N.W. 1/4 Sec. 4, Blk. 
A-S. Cert. 14/2896, H & GN Ry 
Co., on the waters of Sweetwater 
Creek, a tributary of Red River, 
about 9 1/2 miles West of 
Wheeler, Bought and fully paid 
for under the laws regulating the 
sale of public free school land. 

"Beginning at an iron pipe, 
the common cor. Surs. Nos. 4 & 
5, Blk. A-5 and Surs. Nos. 34 & 
35. Rik A-Q 

Thence North 1909 vs to iron pipe 
the common cor. Surs. Nos. 4, 5, 
16, 17, Blk. A-5 

BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 

Beef processed, double wrapped 16t per pound 

lc A Pound for Butchering 

Pork Processing including curing 

Double wrapped 20c per pound 

$4.50 a head for butchering 

We butcher Monday thru Friday 8 to 12 A.M. except holidays. 

CALL FOR QUARTER—HALF—WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK AND BEEF FOR SALE 

SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 
North of City 
	 Phone: 256-3241 

Closing at Noon on Saturday 

• Valve Rebuilders 
a 	•Oil Field Chemicals 

• Machine Work 

v, 	r 2, • Pipe Connections 
•s• 	 • Brake Drum Turning 

R R 	• High Pressure Cleaning Systems 

Phone: 806'845-3951 

P.O.BOX 447 • MOBEETIE, TEXAS 79n6 1 

O E R 
4 

COSMETIC'S 

LADY VENUS: Aloe Vera Cas-
metic's now available at the City 
Cleaners & Fabrics. Call for free 
facial and skin treatment. 82b- 
3268. 	 rtn 

MARY KAY COSMETICS 
Complete line of skin care 
products new shades of Day 
Radiance free skin care classes 
Will travel call 868-5021  or  
write LaVerne Smyth, Box 
174, Miami, Tx. 	rtn 

WANT TO BUY SOME LAND 
in town or close to town. 
Phone: 826-5552, Room #18 

3tp 

CATERING SERVICE FOR 
Wedding & Anniversaries 

Cathy Hunt-826-3298 
Kay Luttrell-826.5279 

2tp 

Full or Part Time RN's Needed to 
Rotate Shifts. Excellent salary, 
retirement, fringe benerrs. 

!Hemphill Co. Hospital. Canadian 
Texas, Call Collect the Director 
or Assistnat Director of Nursing, 
802/323-6422. Equal opportunity 
Employer. 	 rtn 

OIL & GAS LEASES 
I am interested in leasing your 
Oil & Gas Leases, also purchas- 
ing your Minerals & Royalty. 

R. C. Callan 
Box 7473 Amarillo, Texas 79109 

Phone: 806-352-7891 

INC 

• CHEVROLET 

• OLDSMOBILE 

• BUICK 

We're 
unveiling   
the first 
Chevy of 
the '80s on 
April 19TH 

Citation. It's a whole new kind of car. The first 
Chevy with front-wheel drive and transverse- 
mounted engine. Contemporary styling in a 
sporty package that takes up less than 3/4 of a 
parking space, yet carries five adults in comfort. 
It's the most thoroughly tested new car in Chevy 
history. And it'll be here for you to see and test 
drive April 19th. 

211 West Highway 66 Phone 806-256-3293 
Shamrock, Texas 

4 	 

VaVO- 1-11\A S 

" 	P.O. Box 1080 
Phone: 826-3123 

OIL AND GAS LEASES 

I am interested in buying your 
OIL AND GAS LEASES, MIN-
ERALS and ROYALTY. Gene 
Hall, Minco Oil and Gas Co., Box 
2317, Pampa, Texas 79065. 
Phone: 669-6805. 

ROOFING 
Compoisiton or Wood 
12 years experience 

Free Estimates 

Phone: 256-3018 in Shamrock 

before 8:00 A.M. or All 

Day Friday. 	 ltp Wheeler Lodge No. 1099 

A.F. & A.M. 

MONDAY 
7:00 P.M. GUARANTEED 

AUTO GLASS 
INSTALLATION 

& Body Repair 

C'SS 
CA P. CENT'iR 	 G ulf 

STORM-SCREEN • 
WINDOWS 

ermanent yeor-round protection 
hangeable from inside. Easy t 

clean..prowler-proof. Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuer' bills.... 

WH EELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 Wheeler, Tex. 

ine Service for Fine People 

Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler, Texas 

NOTICE 
I will no longer be reponsible 

for any debts other than my own. 
Frank Martin, Jr. 	 4tp 

AMARILLO COIN & 
BULLION INVESTMENTS, 

INC. 
Buy, sell or trade silver & 

gold coins. We have South 
African Krugerrands, Mexican 
50 Pesos, American Gold. 
National Teletype Service. 

We guarantee to buy back 
anything we sell. 
2300 W. 7th 
Amarillo, Texas 

Phone: 806/373-4102 

CLASSIFIED RATES - 
All classified ads must be 

paid in advance, except for open 
tenger account customers. 

Charger arc luc per worth 
Minimum charge is $1.00. 

Card of thanks charges will be 
$2.00. 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds 	5:00 p.m. Monday 
DIsplay 	5:00 p.m. Monday 
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MORRIS CONOCO Want At 
WAITRESS WANTED: Apply at 
Sparlin's Restaurant. 	rtn 

DRILLING 

4tp 

Banks Water Well Service 
& Drilling 

Mobeetie, Texas 
'hone: 845.3431 

Call Mobeetie, 8454421 
Nights - 845-3441 
. 	. 
Floyd Morris 

e 

 

12-4cM 

In Field Service 
On Tractor Flats 

Wet or Dry 

Thence East 961 vs. to point on S.. 
B. line sur. No. 17, Blk. A-5, 
Thence South 950.4 vs to point 
8.2 vrs. N. and 10.6 vs E. of 
center of Sur. No. 4, Blk. A-5, 
Thence East 950.4 vs, to point in 
W. B. line Sur. No. 3, Blk. A-5, 
Thence South 958.6 vs to iron 
pipe, common cor, Surs. Nos. 3 & 
4, Blk A-5 and surs, Nos. 33, 34, 
Blk. A-9, 
Thence West 1911.4 vs.  to place 
of beginnings." 
and containing 486.4 acres of 
land, more or less. 

That the Defendants unlaw-
fully entered upon said "land 
premises and dispossessed 
Plaintiffs therefrom and unlaw-
fully withhold from Piamtirts the 
possession of said , land and 
premises; that Plaintiffs claim 
t title and possession in and to said 
property under Article 55W, 
V.A.T.S., deriving said title 
under a deed dated November 8, 
1943. and recorded in Volume 
105 at Page 619 of the Deed 
Records of Wheeler County, 
Texas: and in the alternative, 
Plaintiffs claim title and possess-
ion in and to the said property 
under Article 5519, V.A.T.S.; 
and Plaintiffs pray for judgment 
for title and possession of said 
land and premises and for further 
relief to which they are entitled, 
and as is more fully shown by 
Plaintiff's Petition on file in this 
suit. 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the date 
of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved. 

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same 
according to requirements of law, 
and the mandates hereof, and 
make due return as the law 
directs: 

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said court at 
Wheeler, Texas, this the 3rd day 
of April A.D. 1979. 

Attest: Paul Topper Clerk, 
31st District Court 

Wheeler County, Texas. 
By Kim Ray, Deputy 

I 

:HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom, 
1 3/4  bath, full basement, carpet, 
paneled, new built-in oven, dish-
washer, stockade fence. You can 
afford this one. 1205 S. Canadian 
Call 826-5792, By appointment 
only. 	 rtndt 

FOR SALE: 16 ft. Sooner boat 
and trailer with Mark 78A Mer- 
cury motor. Phone: 826-5812. 4tp 

FOR SALE: 6 Registered Char-
lois Bulls. Virgil Simmons, 
Phone: 826-5843. 	 rtn 

FOR SALE: Honda Odyesssey, 
Like new, kept in garage. Phone: 
845-3291. 	 2tp 

Tommy Bolin, MASONRY 
CONTRACTOR, Pampa, Tex. 
665-6217, or Wheeler 826-5259 

4tp 

FOR SALE: 1975 Kawaski 500 
motorcycle, only 1300 miles. 
Like new. Phone: 375-2426, 
8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. After 
6:00 p.m. 375-2344. 	4tp 

FREE WINDBREAKER with 
RCA Console T. V. while they 
last. L. & F. Repair. 	rtn 

FOR SALE: 1971 El Cameo with 
hull. Phone: 826-5881 or 
826-5204 after 5:00. 	rtn 

LEGAL NOTICE 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: E. R. BIGGS and wife, 
LILLIAN B. BIGGS, if living; and 
J. H. MOWREY and wife, 
MALLIE M. MOWREY, if living; 
but if a said named Defendant be 
deceased, the legal represen-
tatives of each of said named 
Defendants who is deceased and 
the unknown heirs of each of said 
named Defendants and the legal 
representatives of the said un-
known heirs if they be deceased; 
and the unknown heirs of the 
unknown heirs of each of said 
named Defendants and if they be 
deceased, their legal represent-
atives. GREETING: 

You are commanded to appear 
by filing a written answer to the 
plaintiff's petition at or before 10 
o'clock A.M. of the first Monday 
after the expiration of 42 days 
from the date of issurance of this 
Citation, the same being Monday 
the 21st of May, A.D., 1979, 
at or before 10 o'clock A.M., 
before the Honorable District 
Court of Wheeler County, at the 
Court House in Wheeler, Texas. 
Said plaintiff's petition was filed 
on the 20th day of February. 
1979. 
The file number of said suit being 
No. 7556 
The names of the parties in said 
suit are: 
BENJAMIN CLYDE BARKER 
and wife, ETHEL ANNEDA 
BARKER, as Plaintiffs and E.R. 
BIGGS and wife, LILLIAN B. 
BIGGS, if living; and J. H. 
MOWREY and wife, MALLIE M. 
MOWREY, if living; but if a said 
named Defendant be deceased, 
the legal representatives of each 
of said named Defendants who is 
deceased and the unknown heirs 
of each of said named Defen- 

,R SALE: Two bedroom house, 
cellar, garage and furnished 
apartment. 204 N. Main. Call 
after 5:00, 826-3302 or before 
5:00, 826-5746. 	 rtn 

MUST SELL 
Three year old house, three 
bedrooms with furniture, with 
22'x24' partically finished den. 
On 2'/2 acres, Mobil home park 
with nine spaces. Highway 
frontage, one block from store, 3 
blocks from grade school & high 
school. Mobil Home Park will 
pay mortage payments. See by 
appointments only. Call after 
6:00 P.M. 845-3191. 	rtn 
FOR RENT: 3 Bedroom trailer 
house, fully furnished. Phone: 
R26-5874. 	rtn 

FOR SALE: 11th & Canadian, 2 
bedroom house on 100x150 ft. lot 
adjoining 150x300 ft. lot. This 
property could be sold as all or 
part, 826-3077. 	 2tp 

HELP WANTED 

FOR SALE 
Hemphill County Farm on High- 
way. 640 acres in Gageby area. 
400 acres farmland, 240 acres 
grassland. 	Water test wells 
drilled. 

Joe Haley 806-826-5766 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 

WATERLESS COOKWARE. 
Home demonstration kind. 
Never Opened. $175. Normally, 
$400-$500. 1-303-591-1331. 	4tp 

FOR SALE: John Deere 4-row 
double tool bar lister planter, 
guage wheel drive, 4-row crust 
master knife attachment. 
Phone: 845-2443 	3tc 

DITCH DIGGING 
SERVICE 

CAN DIG DITCH .. 	6-12 INCHES WIDE, 
UP TO 5 FEET DEEP 

Cal l: 	McLean, 779-2247 or 779-2600 
Wheeler, 826-3123 

FOR SALE: Lot 45'x150' ideal for 
mobil home, 504 Reynolds, 
826-5812. 	 4tp 

FOR SALE: Bee Hives $15.00, 
Supers, $10.00. H. E. Cole, 
Mobeetie and 12th St., Wheeler, 
Texas. 	 2tp 
WANTED: Service Station at- 
tendant for day shift. 	Call 
826-5515. 	 rtn THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY MORRIS CONOCO SERVICE 

Auto Parts & Hardware 
Supplies 

Tires-Batteries-Accessories 
Box 87 

Mobeetie, Texas 79061 

Floyd Morris 
845-3421 

• 
TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION 

Published Every Thursday at Wheeler, Texas, By.. .. 

Acception Bids 
The First National Bank in 

Wheeler is accepting bids for 
building, furniture, and fixtures 
at their former location at 500 S. 
Main in Wheeler. 

The legal description for the 
building is: Lot 1 and east 5' of 
lot 2. block 29, original townsite 
of Wheeler. Building bid should 
include vault door. 

A complete list of furniture and 
fixtures will be available at the 
First National Bank in Wheeler. 

The Diebold alarm system will 
.be sold separately. 

The building will be open for 
inspection by appointment. 
Phone 826-5566: ask for Shari 
Porter, Charles Brown or Adrian 
Risner. 

Sealed bids for the building are 
to be separate from the bids for 
the furniture and fixtures. 

Ten percent of the bid price to 
be paid at time bid is accepted. 
Balance due in 30 days to allow 
time to examine abstract. 

Sealed bids should be submit-
ted to Charles R. Brown. First 
National Bank, P.O. Box 1040, 
Wheeler, Texas 79096. 

Bids will be opened at the 
regular meeting of the Board of 
Directors, Tuesday, May 8, 1979 
at 4:00 pm. The board reserves 
the right to accept or refuse any 
and all bids. 

4. 
For fast effective weight control 
take Super Slenderite Capsules 
and E-Vap "water pills". Hy- 
lands Pharmacy. 	 3tp 

WANTED: Sewing and alterat-
ions. Professional quality, reason 
able prices. Childre's clothing 
and formal dresses, specialty. 
Call Mique Allison, 826-3353. 2tc 

STOCKMENS SPECIAL 
Registered Austrailian 

Shepherds 
Reserve Now. Ready to ween 
May 1, Cornetts, Route 1, Cana- 
dian. 323-8206. 	 2tc 

FOR SALE: 1969 Firebird for 
$1050.00. Runs good, clean. 
Phone: 826-3032. 	 2tp 

FOR SALE: '74 Chervolet Cap-
rice Classic. 48,000 miles excel-
lent condition. Phone: 826-5515 
day, 826-5963 night. 	rtn 

WANTED: Greenbelt Electric 
Co-op members to attend their 
1979 Annual Membership Meet-
ing. Around $300.00 in door 
prizes, entertainment and elect-
ion of directors. April 27. 1979 in 
the Bura Handley Community 
Building. Wellington, Texas. 3tc 

FOR SALE: Registered and pure 
bred Polled Hereford Bulls, 9-24 
months. Y. C. Fuchs, Jr. 4 east, 
1/2  north, '/2 east of Sweetwater. 
928.2890. 	 3tc 

GARAGE SALE: Thursday & 
Friday, 9:00 to 5:00, 1111 S. 
Mobeetie St. 

FOR SALE: Hardwick cook stove. 
Bessie Ramsey. 	Phone: 

826-3128. 	 2tp 

House Moving 
SPARLINS-82S-5898 

'-',heeler, Texas 

1puis C. Stos, Owner and Publisher 

. Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879, 

Subscription Rates: 

Wheeler County 	$6.50 

Outside County 	$7.50 
BARNES 

ELECTRIC 
Refrigeration and 
Appliance Repair 

-All Kinds of Wiring-

Whee ler, Texas 

R06/826-5777 

4 
The Cattleman's 

Feed Service 

LOO MI X 

Since 1905 
Liquid Feed Supplement 

4"latural Protein 

*Highest Energy 
• Consumtion Control 
• Fully Pzitented 

TED NELSON 
-`hone: 826-550 

FOR SALE: 1975 Ford Elite. 
Contact Rick DeArment 826- 
5726. 	 2tp 

NOTICE 
Notice of Intent to Change Rates 

Notice is hereby given that 
Greenbelt Electric Coorperative, 
Inc., with general offices located 
in Collingsworth County, Texas, 
whose mailing address is P.O. 
Box 948, Wellington, 	Texas 
79095, has filed with the Public 
Utilities Commission of Texas 
petition of intent to change rtes 
to all consumers. 	Greenbelt 
Electric Cooperative, Inc. intends 
to change its rates as set out in its 
Intent to Change Rates which has 
been filed with the Public Utili-
ties Commission. The date on 
which the change is to be 
effective is June 1, 1979. Teh 
requested rate schedules are 
expected to furnish an average 
rate increase of 16.1% as oppos-
ed to that furnished by the 
existing rate schedules of the 
Cooperative. 

Percy Former, Seey. 

Members Urged To Attend. 

Visitors Welcome. 

FOR SALE: Fiberglas 15' Deep V 
Lone Star boat. 100 Horse John- 
son motor, 256-3980. 	2tp 

WANTED TO BUY: Weiner 
Pigs. Phone 868-4441 	in 
Miami. 	3tp 

HoLcoms 
TRAILER PARK 

West 12th Street 
Phone: 806 826-5810 

or 826-5942 

WHEELER 
REDI-MIX 

REDI-MIX CONCRETE 

SAND 

Washed Gkavel-A11 Sizes 

Office Hours: 7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 

NOTICE 
NOTICE TO DEBTORS 

AND CREDITORS 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF WHEELER 
To those indebted to or holding 
claims against the ESTATE OF J. 
C. MOORE, JR., Deceased, No. 
2089. in the County Court of 
Wheeler County, Texas, Probate 
Matters: 

The undersigned, having been 
duly appointed Independent Ex-
ecutrix of the ESTATE OF J. C. 
MOORE, JR., DECEASED. late 
of Wheeler County, Texas, by the 
Judge of the County Court of said 
County, on the 9th day of April, 
1979, hereby notifies all persons 
indebted to said Estate to come 
forward and to make settlement 
and those having claims against 
said Estate to present them to 
said Executrix within the time 
prescribed by law, at said Exe-
cutrix's address as follows: 

Jewel K. Moore 
P.O. Box 102 

Wheeler, TX 79096 
where she receives her mail. 

Jewel K. Moore 
Jewel K. Moore, Independent 
Executrix of the Estate of J. C. 

Moore, Jr., Deceased 

Dr. Marion Roberts 

OPTOMETRIST 

Phone: 669-3333 

112 W. Kingsmill 

Pampa, Texas 

Omega Grain 
305 S. Alan L. Beat. Blvd. 

Phone: 826-5953 

Wheeler, Texan 

TOYO, NATIONAL 
SUMMIT 

TIRES 
CAR, PICKUP, 

TRUCK & TRACTOR 

(Road Hazard Warranty 

or. Cor & Pickup Tires) 

Prices Competitive 

with ALL Other Brands 

Let Me Write It . . 

CIO. RICHARDSON 

All Types Of 
INSURANCE 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES 
Swags, Cornices, Shutters 

— WE INSTALL FREE —

Telephone: 256-3652 

Brannons Decorators 
Shamrock, Texas 79079 



FLEA MARKET 
SALE 
in Pampa's 

CORONADO CENTER 
SATURDAY--APRIL 21st 

Plenty of spaces available and 
Lots of free parking. 

Non-profit organizations, $2.00 per space--All others $5.00 per space 

BRING YOUR FLEAS--BRING A FRIEND 
STAY ALL DAY! 

SCHEDULE OF CORONADO CENTER FLEA MARKET '79 DATES: 

MAY 19 JULY 21 AUGUST 18 JUNE 16 APRIL 21 SEPT. 15 

Security Federal's 
Money Market 

Certificates Pay 

9.627 % 
This is an annual rate and is subject to change 
at renewal. The Federal Regulations prohibit 
compounding of interest during the term of this 
account. This 6-month investment with a 
$10,000.00 minimum is available at any Sec-
urity Federal office. Federal Regulations re-
quire a substantial penalty for early with-
drawal. 

SECURITY FEDERAL 
SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

Pampa: W. Francis at Gray 
Amarillo: 1501 Polk, 45th & Teckla, 3105 S. Georgia 
Hereford: 1017 W. Park Avenue. 

..._—...a-waxww,nniastraac-weitgaspaiascarainl-WdESPIE119111111MIE 

• 
DT--Jack W Pyburn et ux to Red 
River Says & Loan Assn 4-4-79 
E/3 Lot 1 Blk 43 Shamrock 
RDT--Government Natl Mege 
Assn to Thurman L Rives et ux 
9-26-74 L 10 Blk 1 Sharmock 
M-LA 
AFF--Zeda Campbell et al to 
Velma E Babcock et vir 4-6-79 L 
10 Blk 1 Shamrock M-LA 

Gerald L Childress 4-10-79 2 ac 
int SE% 2 Blk RE 
TMML--The Medlock Co Inc to 
Texhoma Fed Cre Union 4-3-79 

LIST OF INSTRUMENTS FILED 
IN THE OFFICE OF THE CO-
UNTY CLERK AND DISTRICT 
CLERK OF WHEELER CO-
UNTY, TEXAS FROM APRIL 9 
THROUGH APRIL 13, 1979 
APRIL 9, 1979 
AOL--May Pet Inc et al to Sun Oil 
Co 12-28-78 Secs 65, 66 Pt 67 B 
24; 4, 5, 6, 7, 24, A-9 
ASSIGN OVERRID ROY--Lon B 
Turk et ux to M R Terwelp 4-3-79 
16 B 27; N1/2  62, B24; Secs 44, 45, 
22, 37 A-8; Secs 1, 2 Blk A-9 
AOL--HNG Oil Co to Coquina Oil 
Corp 2-20-79 E1/2  Sec 21 Blk A-3 
MD--R C Callan to Springhill 
Corp 4-6-79 15 ac int 51/2  & W220 
ac N'/2 Sec 19 Elk A-4 
MD--Beatrice Valentine Williams 
et vir to R C Callan 3-30-79 5.06 
ac Int 51/2  84 B13 
DT--Robert Moon et ux to Clara 
Rankins 11-8-78 E1/2  Lot 3 Blk 67 
Shamrock, WSSA 
ROW--Clarence E Wilhelm et al 
to Colorado Interstate Gas Co 
W1/2  11 Camp Co Sch Ld 
AFF--John H Williams to Mary 
Emma Mason Williams 4-9-79 
D--John H Williams et ux to 
Ronald D Pitcock et al 4-9-79 
Surface & 20 Acs Mins S'/2 11 
A-8 
DT--Edward L Pitcock et al to 
Federal Ld Bk of Houston 4-4-79 
S1/2  Sec 11 Blk A-8 
4 OLs--Henry Nelson Miller Jr et 
al to Amarillo Oil Co 1-9-79 Sec 

O 42 A-3 
DT--Robert Bonner Trostle et ux 
to United States of Amer 4-9-79 
N1/2  13 Pt 105 B 23 SE% 91 NE'/4 
90 Blk 17 
OPTION--T G Puryear et al to 
Allied Chemical Corp 3-16-79 
Secs 13. 28 W1/2  27 A-3 
D--Lucille Walser to Henry Clay 
Walser Jr et al 3-23-79 Pt N1/2  2 

$ AB&M Sur; E1/2  SE'/4 7 Elk A-3 
NE1/4  Sec 6 Blk L 
APRIL 10, 1979 
QCD--Emma E Hanes to L V 
Hanes 4-9-79 Lots 10, 11, 12, Blk 
5 Lela 
RDT--First Bk & Trust Shamrock 
to Earl Hamill et ux 4-2-79 S50 ft 
L 1 Elk LVI Shamrock 
D--L Jack Harris et ux to Jimmy 
Wayne Harris et al 2-21-79 SE% 

• & S33 ac NE'/4 32 BIk A-7 
3 RELEASE ROW--Pioneer Nat 
Gas Co to Moore, Bailey & 
Hoffer 4-2-79 Pt 58 A-8 Pt 3, 92 
A-5 
8 ROW--Jasper E Bailey et ux, 
Marion E Moore, Florence David 
Bryant. Charlotte D Jelks, E T 
Davis et ux, Marion Averil 
Bryant et ux 12-76 to 4-79 Pt Secs 

• 44, 45, 38. 22, 21 37 Blk A-7; 
NW 1/4  58 A-8; NW'/4 92 A-5; 
SW1/4  3 A-2 
2 OL--Jerry Helton et al to John C 
Vise 3-5-79 L 3 Blk 8; 19. 20 Blk 
12 Briscoe 
OL--E F Herzik et ux to Tom F 
Marsh 3-22-79 Lots 15. 16 Elk 10 
Briscoe 
OL--Icie G Puryear et al to John C 
Vise 3-5-79 Lot 5 Blk 8 Briscoe 
3 COR ROY D--E A Zybach et ux 
to Bob R Zybach et al 4-9-79 
30/40 int SW% NE' 11 Camp 
Co S 
OL--Samuel Cappel Schaffer et 
ux to Thurman W Calcote 3-22-79 
20 ac SE1/4  NE1/4  60 A-8 
RVL--Grant Meek et ux to Gar-
land Moore et al 3-30-79 Pt Sec 
29 Elk A-7 

• MD--Philip E Pendleton et ux to 
R C Callan 4-10-79 24 ac int SE'/4 
Sec 11 Blk A-7 
APRIL 11, 1979 
D--Valie M Jolly to Austin Can-
trell et ux 3-27-79 Lot 2 BIk 59 
Shamrock, WSSA 
D--Lloyd H Cogburn to Austin 
Cantrell et ux 4-3-79 W1/2  Lots 5, 
6 BIk 26 Shamrock 
MD--Glenn 1 Markham et ux to 

ROW--Donald W Biggers et ux to 
Texas Amer Oil Corp et al 
3.29-79 SW1/2  Sec 35 B 17 
2 OL--George C Davis & Edward 
T Davis et uxs 3-1-79 Sec 47 BIk 
A-7 
OL--James D Garner et ux to 
Malouf Abraham 11-15-78 3 ac 
Sec 5 1RR Co Sur AOL Sun Oil 
OL--Frances Sellers et al to 
Malouf Abraham 11-15-78 8.7 a 
NE'/4 5 IRR Co Sur AOL Sun Oil 
Co 
AOL--R C Callan to Sun Oil Co 
1-31-79 N1/2  Sec 23 Blk L 
OL--Charles Helton to Tom F 
Marxh 3.1-79 N1/2  exc 2 ac & 
SW 1/4  10 Blk RE 
11 AOLs--Re-recorded from 
Buckthal, Franklin & Vise to Tom 
F March 1 to 4 '79 Lots in Briscoe 
& 4 ac Sec 2 Blk C 

Old Mobeetie 
Association Meet 

The Old Mobeetie Association 
met for the regular monthly 
meeting Tuesday, April 3, 1979 
in the restored Mobeetie Jail that 
is now the Mobeetie Jail Mu-
seum. President, Sallie Harris 
called the meeting to order at 
7:00 P.M. Austin Caldwell, 
secretary, read the minutes of 
the last minutes and they were 
approved. Bernice Caldwell gave 
the financial report of receipts 
deposited $206.35 with expense 
of utilities and balance paid on 
the cookbooks being $254.09. 
Mr. E. A. Turnbow turned in 
$22.50 for cookbooks sold at 
Shamrock Museum another $4.50 
was turned in for cookbooks. 

The gun was displayed that 
chances are to be sold on at $1.00 
each, it is a Pump Action 
Shotgun 12 guage Wingmaster 
Remington 870. 

Those attending the meeting 
were, Carroll Langley, Grace 
Bright, Mr. and Mrs. E. A. 
Turnbow, Austin Caldwell, Ber-
nice Caldwell and Sallie Harris. 
The gun will be on display this 
week at the Wheeler First Na-
tional Bank. The next meeting 
will be May 1, 1979 at 7:00 at the 
Mobeetie Jail Museum. 

OIL NEWS 
INTENTIONS TO DRILL 
HEMPHILL - Humphreys 
(Douglas) - Moody Energy Co. -
Wright #1 - 660' f N & 1320' f E 
lines of Sec. 122, 41, H&TC - PD 
7600' 
COMPLETIONS 
HEMPHILL - Humphreys 
(Douglas) - McCulloch Oil Cor-
poration of Texas - Mathers 
Ranch #38 - Sec. 166, 41, H&TL -
Comp. 12/29/78 - Pot. 9600 
MCF/D - Perfs. 7068' - 7190' -
PBTD 7250' 
WHEELER - Wildcat - CIG 
Exploration, Inc, - R. W. Brown 
#1-5 - Sec. 5, Camp County 
School Land - Comp. 12/23/78 -
Pot. 600 MCF/D - Perfs. 13753' -
14239' - PBTD 14,317' 

BrewerCelebrates 
80th Birthday 

The children of Mrs. Mary 
Brewer honored their mother on 
Easter Sunday, April 15, at 2:30 
to 5:00 o'clock in the hospitality 
room at the First State Bank in 
Mobeetie. It was her 80th 
birthday. 

Her children are Orvel Brewer 
of Pampa, Betty Talley of Miami, 
Mary Sue Stephenson of Amaril-
lo, Audrey Alexander of White 
Deer and Bulah Grimes of Mo-
beetie. More than 60 friends and 
relatives were present for the 
occasion. There were 10 grand- 
children, and 9 	great-grand- 
children present. Among the out 
of town guests were neice and 
nephew, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Merrett of Grand Prarie. 

Sims and Bush 
Exchange Vows 

Lynn Sims and Suzzanah Bush 
were united in Marriage in the 
United Methodist Church of Mo-
beetie, April 5, at 6:00 P.M. 

They were married by Howard 
M. Bailey of Wheeler with their 
sons, Shane and Robbie as ring 
bearers. 

The Bride's colors were blue 
and white with the bride wearing 
a blue dress and the church was 
decorated with blue and white 
flowers. 

After the wedding ceremony a 
reception was held in the fel-
lowship hall of the church where 
all enjoyed punch and a blue 
tiered bridal cake. 

Much happiness is wished for 
Lynn and Suzzanah by their 
many friends. 

THANK YOU CARD 
We would like to Thank the 

Wheeler County Ambulance Ser-
vice for the Care they gave to 
Lee, while we were going to the 
hospital. They are certainly a 
well trained group. 

Lee and Winnie Klker 

	4 
Church of the Nazarene 

Pastor — Harold Wayne Moore 
Sunday School 
	

10:00 A.M. 
Sunday Worship 	11:00 A.M. 
Sunday Evening 	6:30 P.M. 
Ladies Bible Study 
Thursday 	10:00 A.M. 

Phone: 826-5952 

140'x90' SE% 60 A-8 (Pt SD 11) 
DT--Johnny M Baird et ux to 
Texhoma Fed Cre Union 4-9-79 
140'x90' SE'/. 60 A-8 (Pt SD 11) 
D--Clois Harmer et ux to Roy L 
Newsom et ux 4-3-79 Lots 2 to 8 
BIk 6 Lela 
D--Curtis D Davis et ux to Jack W 
Pyburn et ux 4-5-79 E/3 Lot 1 Blk 
43 Shamrock 

MD--W P Buckthal et ^l to 
Aikman Brothers Inc et al 4-3-79 
Mesne Ints Pt Sec 14 RE 
ROL--Pioneer Production Corp to 
First Natl Bk Amarillo 4-3-79 N 
120 a E1/2  72 Elk M-1 
D--Max Wiley Trustee to 0 B 
Burton 4-11-79 56 ac E'/i 60 A-8 
exc mins & DT Burton to Wiley 
MD--JoAnn Millet Taylor to A W 
Burrell 4-9-79 10 ac int 35 Blk A-8 
2 MD--Ana-Tok Explor Co to R C 
Callan & to Harold T Henslee 
4.10-79 20 ac Each W1/2  14 A-4 
MD--Joe R Weatherly et ux to R 
C Callan 4-11-79 10/320 int W1/2  
13 A-4 
MD--R C Callan to Joe R Wea-
therly et ux 4-11-79 10/320 int 
W1/2  14 A-4 
APRIL 12, 1979 
MD--Luella Conner to A W 
Burrell 4-5-79 30 ac int SE% Sec 
25, A-4 
MD--Tillman 0 Greene et ux to A 
W Burrell 4-7-79 50 ac int SE'/4 
27 A-8 
MD--Dwayne Cox et ux to A W 
Burrell 4-6-79 5 ac int N1/2  Sec 8 
Blk 2 B&B Sur 
MD--Philip E Pendleton et ux to 
Marion A Fallwell 4-10-79 10 ac 
int SE'/4 11 A-7 
OL--Ina M Sanders to Texasd 
American Oil Corp et al 3-30-79 
SW% Sec 34 Blk 17 
OL--Hulda Louise Smith et al to 
John C Vise 2-2-79 S1/2  NE% 7 
A-4 & AOL to Cotton Pet Cor 
ROY D--Hayes Robertson to 
Louise B Robertson 4-7-79 1/8 int 
Pt Sec 8. 9 Blk H 
AOL--R C Callan to HNG Oil Co 
2-27-79 NW'/4 Sec 21 Blk A-3 
AOL--A E Gamble to HNG Oil Co 
2-26-79 SE% Sec 50 Blk A-7 
C/C WILL--Roe Harmon Green 
3-26-79 
STIP--W P Buckthak et al to 
fames B Franklin et al 4-4-79 Pt 
Sec 14 Blk RE 
DISTRICT CLERK'S OFFICE 
#7569 Austin E Burkhalter vs 
Verna Lora Eichelberger 4-9-79 
Suit for Damages 
#7570 E-Z Serve Inc vs Roy L 
Countz 4-9-79 Suit on Debt 
Office closed for Friday—Easter 
Holiday 

4 

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION 
(Including Domestic Subsidiaries) 

LEGAL TIRE OF BANK 

THE FIRST STATE BANK OF MOBEETIE 
CITY 

MOBEETIE 

COUNTY 

WHEELER 

STATE 

TEXAS 

ZIP CODE 

7 9 0 6 1 

STATE BANK NO. 

121 

FEDERAL RESERVE DISTRICT NO. 

11 

CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE 

March 30, 	1979 

ASSETS 

1. Cash and due from depository institutions 	  
2. U.S. Treasury securities 	  
3. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	  
4. Obligations of States and political subdivisions in the United States 
5. All 	other 	securities 
6. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell 

MIL Thou.  

757 
796 

200 

350 

7. a. 	Loans, Total (excluding unearned income) 	........ 7 : 0 0 
/' 

/ 
1 b. Less: allowance for possible loan losses 	  24 

c. Loans, 	Net 	......................... 

8. Lease 	financing 	receivables 	....................... 

9. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 	. 	. 	. 	. 	. 

10. Real estate owned other than bank premises 	  
11. All other assets 
12. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 11) 	  

2 754 

73 

32 
4 962 

LIABILITIES 

13. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 
14. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations) 
15. Deposits of United States Government 	  

16. Deposits of States and political subdivisions in the United States . 

17. All other deposits 	  
18. Certified and officers' checks 
19. Total Deposits (sum of items 13 thru 18) 

4  
38 b  

....‘*,, >>*, .. - 
2. 393 
1 757 

4 542 

a. Total demand deposits 	  2 504 
••••\.% Nk, 

\''''",Xss.. b. Total time and savings deposits I 	: 

20. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 
21. Interest-bearing 	demand 	notes (note 	balances) 	issued to the U.S. Treasury and 

other liabilities for borrowed money 	  
22. Mortgage indebtedness and liability for capitalized leases 	  

23. All other liabilities 	  
24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) (sum of items 19 thru 23) 	. 	. 

25. Subordinated notes and debentures 

2 
4 544 

EQUITY CAPITAL 
26. Preferred 	stock 	 . 	a. No. shares outstanding nom= (par value) 

27. Common Stock 	 a. No. shares authorized 1 7(:)12 

b. No. shares outstanding 1200 (par value) .120 

28. Surplus 	  
29. Undivided profits and reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves 

30. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 26 thru 29) 	  

31. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 24, 25 and 30) 	  

160 

4 962 

MEMORANDA 
1. Amounts outstanding as of report date 

a. Standby letters of credit, total 

b. Time certificates of deposit in denominations of 5100,000 or more 

c. Other time deposits in amounts of 5100.000 or more 	  
2. Average for 30 calendar days (or calendar month) ending with report date 	  

a. Total deposits (corresponds to item 19 above)  	  

'N N. 
'N 

 

• 

' • 

TO ALLISON INDEPENDENT 
SCHOOL DISTRICT TAX PAYERS 

1 
2 
3 
4 
5 

6 
7a 
7b 

7c 

8 
9 
10 
11 
12 

13 
14 
15 
16 
17 
18 
19 

19a 
19b 

20 

21 
22 
23 
24 
25 

26 

27 

28 
29 
30 
31 

Memo 

la 
lb 
lc 

2a 

Tax Relief Amendment H.J.R. NO.1 
Homestead Exemption 

Notice is here by given that Persons who own their residential 
Homestead may apply for a HOmestead Exemption in the amount 
of $5,000.00 off of the Market Value by signing an Afficavit 
at the Office of the Tax Assessor-Collector between the dates 
of January 1, 1979 and April 30th, 1979. 

The owner must sweat and affirm that the property was his 
Residential Homestead on January 1, 1979 and that he has not 
claimed homestead exemption on any other property. Any person 
who makes a false affidavit shall be subject to the perjury 
laws of the State of Texas. 

frt Allison Independent School District 

Assessor 

79014 

Hemphill County: 
John Wilkinson, 
Box 65 
Canadian, Texas 

Wheeler County: 

Thurman Rives 

115 Texas 
Wheeler, Texas 

NOTE.  This report must be signed by an authonted officer(s) and attested by not less than three directors other than the officer(%) Pgning the report. 

I/We, the undersigned  officer(s) do hereby declare that this Report of Condition (including the supporting schedules) is true to the best of my knowledge and belief. 
DATE SIGNED 

April 13, 1979 
SIGNATURE OF OFFICER(S) AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT AREA CODETELEPHONE NO. 

806/845-2311 7e&egyr/ -77-22-m  
NAME AND TITLE OF OFFICER(S) AUTRORIZEOVIO SIGN REPORT We. the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of 

Condition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that it has 
been examined by us and to the best of our knowledge and belief has been 
prepared in conformance with 	the instructions and Is true and correct. 

SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR 

79096 
Helen May Vice—President 

SIGNATURE O. DIRECTOR SIGNATURE OF DIRE OR 

	

c tr/7 / 4 	#210_,4,/ leldie7t44,07.,  

State of 	 Tex 	 County of 	 Wheeler 
Sworn to and subscribed before me this 	13 th 	day f 	April 	19 	 jig: 

and 1 hereby certify that 1 ant not fin officer or director of this bank. 	S - 	_.,. TRRY'S SEAL) 
...1..,..- - - Jib commission expires 	7 -.2.£-* 	 19 ....2k 	::-..,s, 0--A. 	otary Public. 

(MAKE MARX FOR 

IbtaflPalle.lbolarCeta.fau 
SAMMINWMWINSAUdY 

GREENBELT ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE. Inc. 
Greenbelt Electric Cooperative, Inc • P 0. Box 948 • Wellington. Texas 79095 • Telephone (806) 447.2536 

4 

• 

Page 5-THE WHEELER TIMES-Thursday, April 19, 1979 

Court Records 

NORTHWEST OKLAHOMA 
STORM SHELTER 
& BASEMENT CO. 

CONCRETE SHELTERS & BASEMENTS 

FAIRVIEW 

405/227.4357 

Erick Aviation, Inc. 
AERIAL SPRAYING 

Insects o Weeds o Brush 
JON YOWELL 

405 526-3331 	 405.'526-3758 
P.O. Box 569 

Erick, Oklahoma 

4041/2  South Main 

WHEELER, TEXAS 

Phone: 826-3156 
Hours: 10:30.7:30 

Jerry Hefley , Manager 

ANNOUNCING OUR 
ANNUAL MEMBERSHIP MEETING 

FRIDAY. APRIL 27. 1979 
BURA HANDLEY COMMUNITY CENTER 

Registration 1-2 p.m. 
Call To Order 2 p.m. 

BARBECUE 

OFFICIAL BUSINESS 
ENTERTAINMENT Z 
ELECTIONS 
PRIZES 
REFRESHMENTS 

A 

0 



Calif., Mr. and Mrs. Cody Gil-
liland, Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Fran-
ces all of Pampa, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Reid of Wheeler, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bevard Dukes, Deidre 
and Andrea of Allison, Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne Zybach. 

Easter Sunday visitors at the 
Clarence Zybachs were Mr. and 
Mrs. Coye Heard from Groover, 
R. L. and Rozena Zybach, Mac 
and and Gaye Purcell and child-
ren, Eric and Pauline Zybach and 
Misty of Sayre, Virgil and Mae 
Helton of Wheeler, Deedy Zy-
bach. 

Truman and Bettie Zybach 
went to Forace and Neta Evans 
for dinner and at Clarence and 
Irene for supper. 

Darrell Rodenburger family 
visited relatives in Scot City, 
Kansas over the weekend. 

I would rather attemp some-
thing great and fail, than attempt 
nothing and succeed. 

The Rodenburger family ate 

supper with Willis and Verna 
Fillingim last Wednesday. 

The road to success is constan-
tly under construction. 

Sharron, Shriley, Mona Sump-
ter from Booker spent from 
Thursday to Monday with Willis 
and Verna other visitors at Willis 
and Vernas were Vennetta Akins, 
Tommie and Tina Densburger, 
Roy and Pat Hudson and Sheryl, 
Juanita Fillingim, Mayme Mc-
Elroy, Tracie, Kanlina from Lo-
cus Grove. 

Bob and Judy Irvine and girls 
from Alamosa, Colo., visited his 
brother and family the Dick 
Irvines. They all visited in 
Wheeler with Mrs. Grace Irvine. 

Wayne and Tola Fay and boys 
went to Borger Sunday visited 
the A. S. Bynums and other 
relatives. 

I have word the George Clarks 
are in Perryton visiting his 
relatives on their way down here 
I hope to visit her relatives. 

Mary Hudson came home from 

Moteetienwo 

U-U Electrical Service 
"We handle all your electrical needs" 

P.ESIDENTIAL, COMMERCIAL and CYST° 1 

Robe'rt and Laura Underwooc Owners 

	

Sox 269 	Wheeler, Texas:79096 

Coil D  lfno aay 

 or

nsweiNir 

Night: 

	

If 	

5.82264-432150 

WHEELER COUNTY, TEXAS 
Statement Of Receipts And Disbursments Of All Funds For The 

Three Months Ended March 31, 1979 
DISBURSEMENTS 	BALANCE 

FOR YEAR 
RECEIPTS 
FOR YEAR 

-0-
137,087.00 
35,156.70 
29,053.48 
16,839.22 
16,089.82 

575,212.34 
1,952.75 

163,927.05 
-0-

26,734.00 

$1,002,052.36 

$ (4,583.30) 
85.490.63 
46,516.25 
37,997.48 
18,085.90 
50,183.59 

397,159.19 
20,739.52 

202,929.61 
587.79 

36,402.69 

$ 891,509.35 

Jury 

Road and Bridge General 
Precinct #1 
Precinct #2 
Precinct #3 
Precinct #4 
County General 
Court House and Jail 
Lateral Road 
Permanent School Fund 
Revenue Sharing 

Total 

BALANCE 

$ (3,653.30) 
30,017.14 
30,194.16 
32,024.84 
22,126.23 
52,498.30 
67,883.24 
21,407.27 
87,533.62 

587.79 
68,691.47 

$ 409,310.76 

$ 	930.00 
81,613.51 
18,834.61 
23,080.84 
20,879.55 
18,404.58 

245,936.39 
2,620.50 

48,531.06 
-0-

59,022.78 

$ 519,853.82 

BALANCE 
PLUS RECEIPTS 

$ 	(3,653.30) 

167,104.14 
65,350.86 
61,078.32 
38,965.45 
68,588.17 

643,095.58 
23,360.02 

251,460.67 
587.79 

95,425.47 

$1,411,363.17 

JERRIE MOORE, County Treasurer 
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HEFLEY REUNION HELD APRIL 1st 
&law nwo • 

Veto's Parker 
Well we had a ideal Easter 

weekend just a little bit windy. 
Essie, Donald and Charles 

Finsterwald had for Sun. dinner 
guest Mr. and Mrs. Art Smith, 
David, Don and Deanna and a 
friend Mrs. Onita Monzingo from 
Memphis, John and Marie 
Wright, David and Anne. 

Visiting the Colie Parkers over 

the weekend were Ted and Linda 
Parker and Scotty, Garry and 
Nona Parker, Bobby, Randy, 
Shane and Billy and Sheridan of 
Dumas, Weldon and Diana Park-
er Marianda and Michelle from 
Perryton. 

Word is Mary Hudson was 
doing fairly well after surgery in 
Pampa. 

Hoyle Helton and two grand 
children, Jeffery and Christopher 
attended the egg hunt in Wheeler 
Sunday afternoon. She also 
visited in hospital with Beckie 
Zybach, Eula Bradstreet and 
Juannell Manning. 

Nona, Linda and Diana Parker 
took there children to the egg 

Mrs. Aubrey Higdon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Milton Gierhart, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Reeves all from Sham-
rock, Texas. Mrs. Connie Bar-
ham and son, Elk City, Okla.; 
Mrs. Lonnie Kelley and Becky, 
Sweetwater, Oklahoma. 

hospital Friday. Some of her 
visitors were Roy and Pat Hud-
son, Leroy Hudson family, Sy 
and Mary Hudson. I am sure 
Oden and Lois Hudson was there 
statiltkrhes  edtoreLemsotveer 	Mary 

removed . 
had gone back to Dr. to get the 

Giving never empties the purse 
and loving never empties the 
heart. 

I talked to Rita GraySon Mon-
day morning, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Aderholt went home 
with their daughter Estelle Top-
per in Borger to stay a few days 
Saturday. 

Saturday afternoon Fat and 
Wanda Childress, Melvin and 
Kathy Hunt and children, Scot 
and Kay Luttrell and Brani, 
Clyde Jr. and Jane bukes and 
Stacie, Bob and Zodell Swift and 
children went to Lake June had a 
cook sunoduaty. 

they all went to Beef 
County for dinner (except Scot 
and Kay) others at the dinner 
were Wayne and Pat Childress. 

Then they all went back to lake 
June for another cook out supper. 

Addie Swift went to Shannon 
with Brenda Castle and girls to 
visit relatives. 

May Bell Childress visited the 
Colie Parkers Monday morning. 

Visitors with the Oden Hud-
sons over the weekend were Mr. 
and Mrs. Leroy Hudson and 
Butch from Dallas. The Roy 
Hudson family from Stinnett and 
Sharon Gatlin and boys visited 
Saturday. 

The Cliff Walkers spent the 
weekend at Sherwood Shores, 
Green belt Lake, and had with 
the Charles Davis family there. 
Others visitors were the Frank 
Smiths, Pampa; the John Smiths, 
Childress; Darlene Davis, Amar-
illo. and Danny Davis, Canyon. 

hunt. 
Sheridon Parker found a prize 

egg. She received a $1.00 she 
was really happy about that. 

The Parker boys started us a 
barn, we hadn't had one since 
ours burned down. They also 
started my porch that connects 
our 2 houses together. 

Tornado time again if you 
study the atmosphere and clouds 
you can tell by the fell and smell 
of the air, when one can come 
down out of a cloud at the drop of 
your hat. That is time to be 
setting by your cellar door or in 
your celler. A barometer will 
help you out. Another thing I 
know, I have never known a 
tornado traveling or in a cloud 
that does not have BOLT lighting 
with it. 

Roy and Lois Meadows return-
ed home Friday from visiting 
their son, Larry and Pam Mea-
dows in Chicago, Ill., and Rick 
and Lucy Lucus and duaghter 
Charissa at West Port, Kentucky. 

Chick and Phoebe Hartline 
spent the weekend with J. P. and 
Martha Meek. 

Time spent in recording our 
blessings, leaves little time for 
singing the blues. 

Bob, Gena and Steve was host 
to a Easter dinner in their home 
Sunday, those there were Mrs. 
Linda Price and son Damon from 
Riverside, Calif. Miss Kim Wiffle 
from Hunington Beach, Calif., 
Mrs. Ruth Tovar and daughter, 
Jerri from Mew Port Beach, 

On Sunday, April 1st the 
Hefley family met for a luncheon 
and family reunion at Carrol's 
Bar-B-Que. The occasion was to 
honor those with birthdays in 
April or nearto. Those honored 
were W. A. Hefley of Rocky 
Ford, Colorado, George W. Hef-
ley of Shamrock, Fanner Hefley 
of Wheeler. Margaret Moreland 
of Pasadena, Texas and Mrs. 
Sally Atkins of Denver, Colorado. 

Rev. Jim Scott, acting as 
Master of Ceremonies, told the 
assembled group a little about 
the original Hefley family which 
consisted of twelve children, four 
girls and eight boys. Of these 
twelve, six are still living and five 
were able to attend the reunion. 
The total age of those still living 
is 490 years, making their aver-
age age 81 plus. One sister living 
in Bridgeport. Texas was unable 
to attend due to ill health. A 
moment of silent prayer was 
observed in memory of her. Bro. 
Scott then gave the invocation. 

A lovely meal was served by 
Carrol and an evening of visitat-
ion and picture taking was had. 
Friends of the family were invit-
ed for birthday cake and coffee 
from 2 until 5. 

In attendance at the luncheon 
were the following: Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Hefley, Melissa and Mark, 
Mobeetie, Texas; Mr. and Mrs. 
Farmer Hefley, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Hefley, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Hefley and Justin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifford Hefley, Mr. and Mrs. R. 
B. Mann, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Alvey, Todd and Tina all from 
Wheeler. Mrs. Margaret More-
land, Mr. Harmon B. Moreland, 
Mrs. Thelma Warren from Pasa-
dena, Texas. Mrs. Novelle 
Kness. Crosby, Texas; Brett 
Whatley, Shannon Montgomery 
both from Garland, Texas; Mr. 
and Mrs. Gerry Hefley and 
Tracy, Mrs. Terri Hefley Plunk 
from Choctaw, Oklahoma. Mrs. 
Wade Hill, Canyon, Texas; Mr. 
C. B. Beeson and son, Bill, 
Abernathy, Texas; Mr. and Mrs. 
Dennis Hefley. Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Hefley and Alicia, Mr. and Mrs. 
David Hefley, Darren and Kristi 
all of Briscoe, Texas. Mr. and 
Mrs. J. R. Hefley, Jr., Mr. and 
Mrs. Kevin Hefley, Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Hefley, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Buckingham, Bobby and Danny, 
Mr. and Mrs. Winifred Bucking-
ham all of Twitty, Texas. Mr. 
and Mrs. James Hefley, Holly 
and Jill, McLean, Texas; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Hefley, Jay. Russell, 
and Kendall from Electra. Texas; 
Mrs. Alvin Agan, Mrs. Joy Crow, 
Miss Dana Whatley, Randy Ray, 
Carl Johnson all from Pampa. 
Mrs. Marjorie Wallace, Mrs. 
Sam Beeson both from Amarillo, 
Texas. Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Buckingham, Brett and Lacy 
from Kelton, Texas; Mr. and 
Mrs. M. P. Thedford, Littlefield, 
Texas; Mr. and Mrs. Nig Hefley, 
Mr. and Mrs. Malcolm Hefley 
and Heath, Walsh, Colorado; 
Mr. D. W. Hefley, Kingman, 
Arizona; Mr. W. A. Hefley, 
Rocky Ford, Colorado; Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Byrd and four children. 
Those attending from Shamrock, 
Texas were: Mrs. John Hefley, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Clay, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kirk Clay, Shannon and 
Amancia, Richard Hefley, Coleen 
Seeds, James David Hefley, Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Cantrell and 
Cindy, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Hefley, Glenna and Wilma, Rev. 
and Mrs. Jim Scott and Harry 
Clay. Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Vise, 
Happy, Texas; Mr. and Mrs. 
John Robert Henard, Welling-
ton, Texas; Mrs. Sally Hefley 
Atkins, Denver, Colorado; Mr. 
and Mrs. Judge Hefley and son, 
Anadarko, Oklahoma. 

Those friends calling in the 
afternoon were as follows: Mrs. 
Forbus Blakemore. Mrs. Nora 

completely destroyed. He was 
saved by being in a closet. 

Word from the Harold Hard-
castles of Vernon says they 
weathered the storm without 
loss. 

Also, Mary Finsterwald's sis-
ters in Wichita Falls were un-
hurt. 

Hiltbrunner, Mrs. Matt Clay, 
Mr. and Mrs. Cabot Brannon, 
Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Dodgen, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Hrnchiar, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arthur Wells, Rev. and 
Mrs. James Douglas, Mr. and 
Mrs. Royce Lewis, Mrs. Wood-
row Sims, Mr. and Mrs. Huey 
Cook, Mr. and Mrs. Wendell 
Morgan and Clifton, Mrs. Dixie 
V. Martin, Mrs. Janie Bliss, Mrs. 
Jack Garrison, Mrs. Merita 
Bumpers, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Richerson, Mr. and Mrs. B. F. 
Risinger, Mrs. Robert Seeds, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clois Hanner, Mr. 
and Mrs. S. Q. Scott, Mrs. Marie 
Taylor, Mrs. A. C. Brown, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest Henderson, 
Mrs. Zell Bell Williams, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Beaty, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. B. Henderson, Mr. and 

Here & There 
Lana Guthrie 

The Easter Holidays are over 
and I imagine every one is 
settling down to the serious 
business of gardening and plow-
ing and digging dandelions. 

As for me I enjoyed my two 
youngest grandchildren, Melinda 
and Steve, since Friday. Then on 
Sunday night the rest of the 
family came for an overnight 
visit. Bobby and Shevon Guthrie 
of Shamrock joined us for an 
evenings visit. All the family 
went to Shamrock Monday 
morning for a visit with 'granpa' 
Lang. Then driving back to 
Perryton that afternoon tried to 

Wheeler Public 
School Calendar 

Johnny C. Murrell and Johnny 
Lee all of Pampa. 

by Mrs. Wilber Beck 

Those known to be ill in the 
Mobeetie Community who are in 
the hospitals are Mr. Marie 
Grace in Canadian, Douglas 
Baird and Mrs. Audrey Seitz in 
Highland General Hospital in 
Pampa. John (Bee) Haning and 
Glynnda Leatherman in the 
Parkview Hospital in Wheeler. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenny Sherrell 
and Christy Ann of Copan, Okla., 
visited his parents and sisters 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Sherrell, 
Penny and Glenda and her father 
and brother, C. W. Burch and 

Local Cemetery 
Association Meets 

relax for the week ahead. 
I think Harold and Mae Nash 

must have had the best time of all 
Their daughter Marilyn Nash 

from Phoenix, Arizona was here 
for several days. Her aunt, Mrs. 
Nan Mitchell came with her. 
Then during the weekend all 
Mae's sisters and her brother, 
plus other relatives joined them. 
Included were Mr. and Mrs. R. 
L. Rambo, Braggs, Oklahoma; 
Mrs. Jo Denning, Phoenix; Mr. 
Ruth Anderson; Claremore, Ok-
lahoma; Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Mitchell, Borger, Tex. and Jerry 
Mitchell of Canyon. Mae sur-
vived and was quite happy she 
had had a visit with so many of 
her family. 

Edna Wright has been enjoy-
ing a visit from her niece, 
Margarita Cooper of Payola, 
Kansas. 

The Ed Rileys enjoyed most of 
their family on Easter Sunday. 
They were Bob and his family 
from Clarendon, Jack and Mary 
Mitchell and family from White 
Deer, James and Ann Henderson 
and family who live here. Nelda 
Brewer who lives in California 
with her family could not be here. 

Larry and Suzanne Hampton 
were hosts to her family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Brock from Albuquerque 
and their son Larry. 

I missed a bit of news last week 
that I should have reported. 

Kathy Maddox of Dallas was 
here to help celebrate her dad's 
birthday. Kathy's dad is Tommy 
Hennard. 	I didn't ask the 
number of candles on the cake. 

Mary Finsterwald went to Lu-
gart Lake last week to join a 
family reunion. Her sister Tom-
my Cummings came from Borger 
and joined her. They reported a 
good time, but all the family 
could not attend. 

Willie Mae Stevens returned 
Sunday from a trip to Wichita 
Falls where she had gone to 
check on her daughter and 
family. They and their property 
were unharmed in the tornado, 
but the devestation in parts of the 
City was unbeleivable. Another 
daughter of Willie Mae's lives in 
Childress, but she had gone to 
Vernon the day of the storm. She 
was unhurt -just scared. 

Willie Mae reported that the 
home of J. M. Wallace, son of the 
late Mrs. Cora Wallace, was 

Richard's 
RADIATOR & HEAD 

SHOP 
Complete Radiator 

and 

Cylinder Head Work 

301 E. 12th 
Ph. 256-3151 

Shamrock, Texas 
Richard Blakemore 

Owner 

The Wheeler Cemetery As-
sociation had a called meeting 
Wednesday, April 11, 1979 at 
2:30 in the Commissioners court 
room of Wheeler Courthouse. 
The purpose of the meeting was 
to elect a director to take the 
place vacated by the death of Mr. 
J. C. Moore who was chairman of 
the Board. 

The meeting was called to 
order by Sallie Harris with one 
board member absent. Those 
attending were Johnnie Reed 
Co-chairman, Bob Taylor, Far-
mer Hefley. Mr. B. M. Barham 
was nominated by Johnnie Reed, 
and seconded by Farmer Hefley 
to be board member to take the 
place of J. C. Moore. He was 
unamiously elected to be Chair-
man or the Board. 

With Mr. Barham as Chairman 
the board members now consist 
of Johnnie Reed as co-chairman, 
and members Bill Hampton, 
Farmer Hefley and Bob Taylor. 
Caretaker, Bud Holdeman, re-
ported the tires on the riding 
mower in bad condition so the 
board directed him to purchase a 
new set of tires for the mower. 
Sec-treasure reported dues col-
lected for 1978 were, $1,129.50, 
Phillips Oil Lease for $9,000.00, 
lots sold $410.00 School Tax 
$8.72, repairs and gasoline. 
$292.72, welding $3.00, wages 
paid for labor and secretary 
$2,221.75. $8,000.00 was put 
into C.D. at the First ational 
Bank of Wheeler, Texas for 4 
years. $1,000.00 was put into the 
checking account making a ba-
lance on hand in checking ac-
count $3,167.70. 

The meeting adjourned to 
meet atain when in need of board 
decision. 

Bock Horton Is 
On Dean's List 

Brock M. Horton, the son of 
James amd Madge Horton of 
Fort Wingate, N. M. has been 
nominated by the University of 
N. M's Dean of Arts and Scien-
ces, and was elected to be on the 
Deans Honor roll list which 
makes him eleigible for a scho-
larship fund that is available only 
to those on the deans list. This 
list is less than 1% of all U.S. 
College and University Seniors. 
Brock is the grandson of Sallie 
Harris of Wheeler, and Jess and 
Gazelle Patterson of Mobeetie. 

Brock was also a candidate for 
president of the University Stu-
dent body. 

Will last weekend. They also last=s_  
April 19 Regional Track and 
Tennis - Girls - Leveland. HECE 
Banquet at Pampa. 
19-20-Regional 	Interschol- 
astic at Levelland. 
20-8th Grade Play in School 
Auditorium. 
20-21 Key Club Convention in 
Dallas. 
23-Senior Auction. 
24-Band Banquet. 
26-Regional Track and Tennis - 
Boys - Levelland. 
27-Operetta-Kindergarten thru 
4th grade. 
30-Athletic Banquet. 
30-May 4 Kindergarten Visita- 
tion Week. 

Volleyball 
Tournament 

The to ament was held 5, 6 
& 7th of April. Trophies were 
presented to each team. 

Women's winners were: first, 
Lightning Bar Appaloosa 
Second, A.B.C.; third, Mobeetie 
M & M; consolation, Water's 
Livestock. 

Men's winners were: first, 
Terry's Team; second, Ware 
Chevrolet; third, Melvin Simp-
son; consolation, Mean Green. 

We appreciated everyone who 
helped and brought food during 
the tournament. Thanks to all 
the teams that participated and 
made it a success. 

Pucusso's 
Ceramics & Arts 

105 W. 6th 

visited Mr. and Mrs. W.A. 
Leatherman and Allen and Mrs. 
Wilber Beck while here. Glenda 
accompanied her brother and 
sister in law home for a visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tince Williams 
and their daughter Peggy Dunn 
visited the gentleman's brother, 
Doc Williams of Turkey, who was 
a patient in the High Plains 
Hospital in Amarillo, last week-
end. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. St. John are 
visiting their son and family Mr. 
and Mrs. Byron St. John in El 
Campo this week. 

Rev. L. V. Grace attended to 
business and visited in Pampa 
Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs.'  Earl Riley of 
McLean visited her sister and 
brother in law Mr. and Mrs. B. 
Haning Sunday afternoon. 

Mrs. Anna Lee Sims and Mrs. 
Carla Sims and girls shopped in 
Pampa, Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Burl Cooper of 
Jacksonville visited her brother 
and sister and their families from 
Tuesday until Sunday. They 
visited C. W. Burch and son Will 
and Mrs. Wilber Beck and Mr. 
and Mrs. W. A. Leatherman. 

Thursday they with Mrs. Beck 
went to Pampa to visit another 
sister Mr. and Mrs. Le. E. Kieth, 
coming back to Mobeetie Satur-
day morning. In the afternoon J. 
D. Sackett who resides at the 
Pampa Nursing Center in Pamp, 
with his daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Bryant, Daniel and Carol of 
Amarillo came to visit for a few 
hours with everyone. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Gudgel 
and family of Oklahoma City, 
visited his parents and brother 
Mr. and MRs. Eugene Gudgel 
and Ronald during the Easter 
weekend. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Selby and family during 
the Easter Holiday was her 
brother and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilbur Wells and son Mike of 
Altus, Okla. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tince Williams 
visited their daughter, Mrs. Peg-
gy Dunn in Wheeler, Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Brooks Mc-
Laughlin spent several days last 
week with his sister Mrs. Martha 
Sides who was ill in Borger. 

C. W. Burch visited and at-
tended to business in Pampa. 
Saturday morning. 

Sunday evening guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Selby were Mrs. 
Nancy Heard, Dixie and Jennie, 
Mrs. Lucy Hale, Mr. and Mrs. 

THANK YOU 
Alph Mu Alpha Chapter of 

Beta Sigma Phi would like to 
thank all those who helped make 
our Bake Sale a success. 	A 
special thank you to Roark's and 
Thriftway for letting us hold it in 
their stores. 

Proceeds from this sale will go 
to a Senior Scholorship. 

Wheeler, Texas 

826-3351 

CERAMIC & ART CLASSES CLASSIFIED: 
FOR SALE: 2 Mobile Home 
Porches with tops and hand rails, 
1 — 8'x12' and other 8'x15' 
covered with football turf. Also 6 
Mobil home axles 10' wide with 
wheels and tires that have elect-
ric brakes. Call 826-3015 or come 
by 1101 S. Mobeetie to see. 2tp 

FOR SALE: 74 Chev. 1/2  ton 
custom Deluxe with 75 Tropicana 
cab over camper, fully self con-
tained. Will sell separate. 300 
N. Texas 256-3980. 	2tp 

FOR SALE: One refrigerator, 
good condition, 20 cu. ft. One 
blue roam mare with papers. 
Call 826-3396. 	 ltp 

Are you EXPECTING A NEW 
BABYin April or May? I would 
like to keep your new born when 
you go back to work. Experien-
ced, have raised S of my own. 
Call Vera Brickey, 826-3070 after 
5:00P.M. 	 2tc 

Thursday Morning 

9:00 to 11:00 A.M. 
Anyone interested, be there at that time! The most long-lived animal is 

the giant tortoise of the 
Galapagos Islands, where 
specimens have been estimat-
ed to be as old as 190 years. Mon. & Thurs. Nights 

7:00 P.M. to 9:00 P.M. 
ALANA D MJGHTRY Owner THE  SHIRT SHACK 

di  OPEN NOW ste 

.••••••• 	 .11ii• ••••Mge 

S 

114 East Texas St. 
Candy & Sherri Lewallen 

San Marino, a country 
surrounded by Italy, is said 
to be the world's oldest 
and smallest republic. 

enai 

Write Your Own Success Story 
Individuals like you have proven what it 

takes to discover their 

Greater Potential 
as independent Conklin Distributors 

IT TAKES... 
• Belief in yourself and your abilities. 

II Desire to provide quality services and 
products to friends and neighbors 

II Commitment to build a secure future for 
yourself 

• Action to pick up your phone and contact: 

HOWARD & SUNNY HILL 
Wheeler, Texas 

806. 826-5540 

Independent Conklin Distributor 

CONKLIN COMPANY, INC. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to express our thanks 

for all the cards, flowers, food, 
visits, phone calls and prayers 
that we received from our friends 
and loved ones during our time of 
sorry. Words fail to express what 
we feel in our hearts for each of 
vou. 

May God richly bless you. 
The BW Hanks family 

CARD OF THANKS 
To the dear hearts and gentle 

people in our home town. Love is 
our most precious commodity 
and we found it abundately at the 
loss of our beloved "Rusty". 
Thank you for food, flowers, 
thoughts and prayers and may 
the heavenly light shine on each 
of you. 

The Goads 
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Mrs. Britt 

WHEELER ABSTRACT COMPANY 
Ruth & Neil Rogers 

THE WHEELER TIMES 
Louis & Barbara Stas 

TIMES FASHIONS 
Ed & Patricia Forrester 

HIBLER IMPLEMENT 
Lee & Pam Hibler 

LANCASTER DEPT. STORE 
Lewis & Inez Lancaster 

WHEELER VETERINARY CLINIC 
Tommie & Betty Hennard 

ROGUE THEATRE 
Richard Nall, Manager 

THRIFTWAY 
Johnny & Donna Velasquez 

WHEELER LUMBER COMPANY 
Wayne & Joyce Edwards 

WIL-MART 
Jerry Wilson 

KOSHARE SHOP Fine Jewlery 
Frank & Korene Walker 

ROARK'S FINE FOODS 
Bob & Maxine Roark 

WHEELER FLOWER SHOP 
Jim & Sharon Wright 

MARK'S CAR WASH 
Mark Frankenbery 

WHEELER REDI-MIX 
R. J. & Georgia Smith 

RIVES INSURANCE AGENCY 
Thurman & Donald Rives 

PIERCE'S TRADING POST 
Marvin Pierce 

OMEGA GRAIN 
Daryl Snelgrooes & John C. Vise 

RAYMOND'S DRIVE-IN 
Raymond & Willodean 

CROSS CAR CENTER 
David and Kathleen Cross 

MAC'S ALIGNMENT 
Mac & Mary K. Christner 

HARVEY'S FAMILY RESTAURANT 
Come See us 

HAMPTON'S "66 TRUCK STOP 

L & F REPAIR 
Frank & Leona Coates 

UEWALLEN INSURANCE AGENCY 
Jim & Verena Lewallen 

THE DOT SHOP 
Richard and Lynda Wallace 

FRANKENBERY'S TEXACO 
Bob & Valetta Frankenbery 

BAKER AUTOMOTIVE 
Dwayne & Bobby Baker 

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
i,n Wheeler 

LEE HARDWARE & 
FURNITURE 

Loyd and Anna Ruth Lee 

PRODUCTION CREDIT ASSN. 
James, Glenda & Jean 

LOYD'S & STREET'S Ben Franklin 
Lyndon & Novelene Loyd 

SPARLIN'S RESTAURANT 
Glen & Faye Sparlin 

TRADING POST 
Marvin Pierce 

WHEELER CO-OP 
Danny & Brenda Mitchell 

BEEF CATTLE COMPANY 
WARE CHEVROLET COMPANY 

N. D. & Roberta Ware 
PETE BURTON FORD 

Pete & Gay Burton 

ON S 

N 

CONGRATULAT 
STUDENTS 

ON YOUR DIST. 
U.I.L. 

Jonathan Douglas 
Rich Brown 

David Wright 

Miles Farnsworth 

Jeff Parker 
Letha Estes 
Cathi Stas 

Barbara Kreyling 

TENNIS 

Phillip McWhorter 

Ty Henderson 

Beth Wills 

TRACK 

Mike Gallagher 

Ty Henderson 

Kevin Andis 

Benny baker 

Toby Bradstreet 

Lori Lee 

Missy Wiggins 

GOOD LUCK 
AT REGIONAL 

THIS AD SPONSORED BY THE FOLLOWING BUSINESSES AND INDIVIDUALS: 
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APRIL IS CANCER CONTROL MONTH Federated Women 
Honors Mrs. Britt own family. 

If you have any questions 
concerning cancer memorials, 
films, or cancer services, call a 
neighborhood volunteer. Maur-
eta Stribling-Mobeetie, Bobby 
Horn-Briscoe, Rita Grogson-Al-
lison, Thomas Helton and Betty 
Hennard-Wheeler. 

Members of the Crusade team 
will be wearing identifiable name 
tags. Please Help. 

THANK YOU r): Wade Wills, Scott Wright, 
Billy Westmoreland, 	Mark 
Moore, Don Smith and Lance 
Reames. 

JR. HIGH TENNIS: Six young 
men from Wheeler placed in the 
District Tennis meet last week. 
Pictured above are (back row, 1 to 

Mrs. David Britt, member of 
the Thursday Review Club, was 
twice honored at the Top of Texas 
District TFWC spring convention 
in Dumas, April 6th and 7th. 

Friday evening she was pre-
sented with a plaque designating 
her as district Poet Laureate for 
having won three first places in 
four possible catagories of com-
petition. 

At the Saturday luncheon she 
received a second plaque making 
her an honorary junior member 
of the federation for having 
displayed unusual concern, 
friendship, and support for the 
younger members of federation. 

April has been designated as 
Cancer Control Month through-
out the Country. 

The Wheeler Unit of the 
American Cancer Society will be 
marching from house to house 
soon to do their part in insuring 
that research and study may 
continue in the fight against 
cancer. 

Join in and do your part as a 
citizen and become a part of the 
concerned team for the control 
and cure of Cancer. 

Community towns, local club 
organizations, and school stu-
dents will all be a part of the 
dedicated team that makes the 
financial driver each year. 

Please receive these people, at 
least with a smile and thank you, 
and give what you can. We may 
be helping some member of our Win Dist. Track 

Hospital Notes 

donated time, money, and items 
to help make it such a success. 
Mobeetie Benefit Committee 

Ada Lester, Charley Sherburne, 
Kay Hamilton, Pinky Hamilton 

WINNER OF STEREO given by 
Mobeetie Street Repair Benefit 
was Mr. Joe Montgomery of 
Wheeler. 

Old Admissions: 
4-8 	Amy Watts 
4-10 	Thomas Green 

John Hanning 
New Admissions: 

Some people used to believe 
that if you placed fern-seed 
among money, the money 
would never decrease, no 
matter how much was spent. 

forward to the first grade. They' 
have learned that every holiday 
brings a party and they are ready 
to celebrate. 

Pictured (back to front) are 
Chris Crofford, Anissa Sims, 
Shelly McCasland, Jennifer 
Walker, Angelique Sims, Matt 
Robers, and Michelle Fancher. 

Kindergarten Students 
Enjoy Easter: 

The Kindergarten students 
enjoyed their Easter Party by 
hunting easter eggs, eating bun-
ny cookies, drinking juice and 
playing games. The kindergar-
ten has experienced many new 
things this year and all looking 

Sheryl Estes and Brenda Seitz 
will represent Mobeetie at the 
Regional Track meet this Thurs-
day and Friday at Levelland. 

Estess won the 440 meter race 
with a time of 64.7 in District 
competition. Seitz won second in 
District in the 100 yd. dash with a 
time of 12.4. 

The Mobeetie Street Repair 
Benefit was termed a big sucess. 
A total of almost 1300.00 was 
raised. 

We wish to thank everyone for 
all their help and support. Also 
to express our special thanks to 
these merchants who donated 
items to our White Elephant 
Sale: Lee Hardware, Loyd's & 
Street's Ben Franklin, Pierce's 
Trading Post, Hobby Store and 
More, Mobeetie Drug Store, 
Mobeetie Grocery, Morris Cono-
co. 

And to all the individuals who 

FOURTH PLACE: In the district 
competition, these three girls 
placed fourth in • doubles and 
singles play. Andrea McGaug- 

hey and Sherry Shelton played 4-14 
doubles and Twyla Collins play- 4-15 
ed singles. 

• EGG HUNT A SUCCESS 

4-11 	Rosemary Banks 
C. B. Brotherton, Jr. 

4-12 	Etta Crouch 
4-13 	Eula Markham 

Frank Caswell 
Glenda Leatherman 
Ed Smith 
Daniel Blocker 
Becky Zybach 
Jim Garner 
Jane Dupont 

4-14 	Lorraine Wagner 
Nelda Bradstreet 

Dismissals: 
4-11 	Virginia Holdeman 

Shirley Pollet 
Eula Markham 
Claude R. Cox 
Willie Hefley 

4-12 	Glenda Coykendall 
Owen Jones 
John Holcomb 
Shelby Pettit 
Carletta Burton 

4-13 	Hutch Moore 
Becky Zybach 

4-16 	Jim Garner 
Daniel Blocker 
Cecil Snelgrooes 
Juanell Manning 

4-17 	Frank Caswell 
Rosemary Banks 

Lesson 
From Page 1 

"If we can stay healthy and get 
some breaks, we can go to the 
Cotton Bowl," says Verden. 
"We're got the material, but 
must stick together as a team. 
Personally, I just want to help the 
team out. Whatever comes after 
that, is fine. 

"If we do go all the way, Coach 
Dockery will be a major reason. 
He's a good coach who doesn't 
mind getting in and working with 
the players. He'll take you off to 
the side and correct you, whereas 
some coaches merely oversee 
practice." 

Verden has half his college 
career ahead of him, but visions 
of pro football dance in his head. 

"I have thought about pro 
ball," says Verden. "But I'm not 
worring about it. If I get the 
opportunity, MI play." 

Whether he does or not, one 
thing is certain—Jim Verden has 
arrived. 

"Wheeler Vet. Clinic" - ($2.00) -
(eggs). Joe Dan Ledbetter, Hea-
ther Eliason, Bruce Atwood, 
Burce Atwood, Chris Helton. 
"Wheeler Abstract" - ($1.00) -
(eggs). Jerry Crow, Jessica 
Dyer, Daniel Elliott, Joni An-
drews, Amy Vanpool, Mandy 
Rogers, Jamie Kreyling, Darrell 
King, Samantha Gaines, Shan-
non Beard, Shannon Beard, Ter-
esa Williams, Mitchie Loyd, Bry-
an Kenney. 
"Times Fashion" - ($1.00) -
(eggs). Ananda May, Isaac 
Hawks, Billy Hennig, Rodney 
Jack Weatherly. 
"Melvin May, Mobeetie - ($1.00) 
(eggs). Jeremy Jones. Britton 
Davis, Amy Vanpool, Christi 
Hill, Melissa Chapman, Billy 
Fencher, Janet Carter. Sharron 
Mitchell, Shanna Tucker. Mit-
chie Loyd. 
"Jackie May, Mobeetie" -
($1.00) - (eggs). Jeremy Jones, 
Brandi Jones Charlene Cordova, 
Bubba Smith, Mike Kobernick, 
Ray Pettit, Mandy Rogers, Carl 
Knutson, Matt Roger. 
"Mark's Car Wash" - ($2.00) -
(eggs). Scotty Stribbling, Jana 
Velasquez, Bobby Sword, Sissy 
Benavidez, Lorie Lee. 
"Mcllhaney's Dry Goods" - 
"Roark's Fine Foods" - ($1.00) -
(eggs). Christy Janssen, Christy 
Janssen, Shawn Miller, Danny 
Nelson, Shannon Seitz, Cory 
Cornett, Bruce Attwood, Heather 
Eliason. 
"Sand and Sage Motel" - ($1.00) 
- (eggs). Cristy Glassey, Dristi 
Garrett. Ray Pettit, Mandy Ro-
gers, Amanda Traeger. 
"Omega Grain" - ($2.00) -
(eggs). Cindy Keelin, Elissa 
McGaughey, Heath Hiltbrunner, 
Alice Fargo, Bruce Atwood. 
"K.D. Ford" - ($1.00) - (eggs). 
Laci Diggs, Rita Traeger. 
"Frankenberry's Texaco" -
($2.00) - (eggs). Jason Miller, 
Layci Diggs, Jeremy Jones, 

Over 200 youngsters from the 
area attended the Easter Egg 
Hunt Sunday at the Wheeler air 
strip. The highly successful 
event offer 149 prize eggs rang-
ing in value from $1 to $5. 

The youngsters were divided • into four age groups. The prize 
eggs were divided, giving each 
youngster an equal opportunity 
to find a prize among the 
estimated 2,000 eggs scattered 
over the area. 

The event this year was spon-
sored by Loyd's and Street's Ben 
Franklin with the cooperation of 
area businesses and individuals 
who donated the prize money. 

The sponsors expressed their 
appreciation and thanks to those 
who donated prizes, helped with 
the work involved and otherwise 
cooperated in making the event 
the success it was. 
"Thriftway Grocery" - ($1.00) -
(eggs). Tammy Keelin, Michelle 
Davis, Katherine Glazner, Wade 
Kobernick, Leah Willsie, Janet 

• 
Carter, Tonya Parker, Jamie 
Kreyling, Frnkie Fancher, Kristi 
Lunsford. 
"Thriftway Grocery" - ($2.00) -
(eggs). Randy Finsterwald, Mi-
chelle Davis, Christy Glassey. 
Shane Whitely, Stephanie Beard. 
"Thriftway Grocery" - ($5.00) -
(eggs). Bubba Smith, Allison 
Fargo. 
"Taylor Petroleum" - ($1.00) - 

• (eggs) - Mitchie Loyd, Joanna 
Irvine, Roger Brown, Shannon 
Beard, Jana Velasquez, Tommy 
Velasquez, Shawn Glenn Miller, 
Sheri Parker, Tera Henderson, 
Jeremy Brown. 
"U-U Electrical Services" Bob 
and Laura Underwood - ($5.00) -
(eggs) - James George, Donni 
Garrett, Randy Finsterwald 
ba Smith, Scottie Stribling. 
"Hiram and Mary Whitener" 
(Post Master) - ($1.00) - (eggs). 
Shanna Tucker, Heather Eliasen, 
Dustin Weatherly. 

Shane Davis. 
"First State Bank Mobeetie" -
($1.00) - (eggs). Jeff Tidwell, 
Jason Miller, Randy Finsterwald, 
Jenne Garriet, Don May, Jana 
Velasquez, Katerine Glazer, 
Candy Atwood, Heath Hiltbrun-
ner, Mandy Rodgers. 
"Anonymus" - ($1.00) - (eggs). 
Jerimy Jones, Bubba Smith, 
Amanda May, Sissy Benavidez, 
Jannet Carter. 
"J and J Shamrock" - ($1.00) -
(eggs). Teri Henderson, Donna 
Garriet, Amanda May, Candy 
Atwood, Jannet Carter. 
"Lancaster's Dept. Store" -
(eggs). Misty Glassey, Kristi 
Simpson, Don May, Janine Irv-
ine. 
"Baker Auto" - ($2.00) - (eggs). 
Shane Davis, Samantha Gaines, 
Shane Whitely, Shane Whitely, 
Donni Garret. 

Wheeler 4-H 
Club Meet Mon. 

S 
Feffney 

Dawn Granger is shown here 
with four other gnerations of her 
family; she is being held by her 
great-great grandmother, Ethel 
Shackelford. Pictured (I to r) are 

Bonnie Louise Granger, mother; 
Bonnie Floyd, grandmother, and 
Grace Bright, great-grandmot-
her. The picture was taken when 
the family gathered at Mobeetie. 

FIVE GENERATIONS: 

The Wheeler 4-H Club met last 
Monday, April 9 in the District 
Courtroom of the Wheeler 
Courthouse. 

Following the business meet-
ing Don King presented a pro-
gram on Pet Care. 

After the program refresh-
ments were served by Tammy 
Baker Wheeler 4-H Club vice-
president. 

Eight members were present 
for the meeting: Tammy Baker, 
Hope Coffman, Jimmy Bryant, 
Draton Childress, Teresa Martin, 
Randy Martin, Augie Hennard 
and Cecil Bryant. Also present 
was County Extension Agent, 
Linda Daughtry. 
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Cans 
300 89c 25 

KRAFT HALFMOON 

CHEDDAR $ 
CHEESE 10 oz. 

Pkg. 

CUT YOUR FOOD BILL . . . CLIP AND 
REDEEM GROCERY COUPONS. 
WE ARE HAPPY TO ACCEPT THESE 
COUPONS AND THEY WILL SAVE 
YOU MONEY. 

CUT YOUR FOOD BILL WITH THESE MEAT SPECIALS 
GRADE A 

FRYERS 
C 

WILSON'S 
Bulk Sliced 	$ 	09 
BACON  Lb. 

FRESH PRODUCE 
RED DELICIOUS 

APPLES. 39c 
CRISP -TASTY 	 at ot  
CELERY s- 44C 
CELLO PACK 

RADISHES 4  ?3:1; 29c 
GIALPREDiRUIT.  

WHOLE 

Lb. 

DEL MONTE 

LEAF 
SPINACH 

303   
Can 

 

KRAFT 

Italian Tangy 
DINNER 

8 oz. 49, 
Box 

SUNSHINE 

CHIP-A-R00 
COOKIES 

$125 
17 oz. 
Pkg. 

SPAM 
with CHEESE 

12 oz. $1 
3  

Can Apple, 
Grape 

2 lb. 

JAMBOREE 

Preserves 

9 oz. 
Box 

GRADE A 
HONEY 
BUNS 

VAN CAMP 

PORK and 
BEANS 

VAN CAMP 

White or Golden 
HOMINY 

4 

PARKAY 

SQUEEZE 
MARGARINE 

16 oz. 
Only 

SWANSON 

Fried Chicken 
BREASTS 

Box 
22 oz.  

$ 99 

VELVETTA 

CHEESE 
SPREAD 

1 lb. $ 1 
39  

Box 9c 

LIBBY'S 

VIENNA 
SAUSAGE 

Cans 

EAGLE BRAND 

MILK 

7 14. oz. 	 C 
C. 

HEINZ 

CATSUP 

RAIDERS 

SWEET 
POTATOES 

303 41! Can 


	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8

