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4-H JUNIOR RODEO RESCHEDULED, 
PERFORMANCES THURSDAY it FRIDAY 

Leo Lamb Rites 
Are Read Monday 

riding, pole bending, flag race 
and golfette. Events for girls 6.9 
include barrel race, walking lead, 
pole bending, flag race and 
golfett. 

On Friday night the 10-14 
year old and 15-19 year old age 
groups will compete. 
Boys 10-14- can choose from 
steer riding, breakaway roping. 

bareback ponnies, barrel race & 

calf daubing. walking 	lead, 

barrel race, and pole bending. 

In the 15-19 age group. events 
for boys will be calf roping, 
ribbon roping, bull riding, bare-
back riding and calf daubing. 
Events for the girls will be steer 
undecorating, calf daubing, flag 
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race. barrel race. and pole bend-
ing. 

There will be a jackpot steer 
saddling on Friday night. The 
steer saddling will be open to 
boys and girls of any age through 
19 years. 

Another Wheeler County 4-H 
Junior Rodeo is scheduled for 
August. 

The rodeo is being put on by 
the Wheeler County 4-H Texans. 

Anyone wishing to enter 
should call the County Extension 
Office in Wheeler at 826-5243 or 
Don King at 826-3249. 

The admission price is $1.00 
per person for those 6 years and 
older. 

Bill Hext will be the stock 
contractor. 

The Wheeler County 4-H Jun-
ior rodeo originally scheduled for 
May 25-26, was rained out and 
has been rescheduled for this 
Thursday and Friday, May 31 
and June I. 

it 

	

	The books have been reopened 
and entries will be accepted until 
7:30 p.m. each night. 	The 
pre-school and 6-9 age groups 
will compete Thursday night and 
the 10-14 and 15-19 groups will 
go Friday night. 

The young cowboys and cow-
girls will be in action Thurs. night 
when the preschool and 6-9 year 
age groups are scheduled to 
compete. 

Events for pre-
school include Stick Horse Barrel 
race, boot scramble, goat ribbon 
race and sack race. 

Boys 6-9 years of age may 
compete in barrel race, calf Emergency Care Attendent 

Course To Begin May 31 

H. Leo Lamb, 54, died Satur-
day in Amarillo. 

Services were at 2 p.m. Mon-
day at First Baptist Church with 
Rev. David Campbell of Panhan-
dle and Rev. Jerry Hogan. pas-
tor, officiating. Burial was in the 
Wheeler Cemetery by Wright 
Funeral Home. 

Mr. Lamb was born in Palo 
Pinto and had lived in Wheeler 
County most of his life. He was a 
farmer, a veteran of World War 
II and a member of the First 
Baptist Church. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Bonnie; three sons, Allen of 
Amarillo. Ronald of San Francis-
co. Calif. and Steve of Wheeler; 
two daughters, Mrs. Carol Floyd 
of Arlington and Mrs. Debora 
Jeffers of Fritch; one brother, 
T.H. of Downey, Calif.; two 
sisters. Mrs. Lou Richards of 
Lancaster, Calif. and Mrs. Virgie 
McCasland of New Orleans, La.; 
and two grandchildren. 

Pall bearers were Boyd Austin, 
W.A. Funderburk, Virgil Patter-
son. N.L. Sechrist, James Vcrden 
and Don Whiteley. 
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Last Minute Repairs 
The Wheeler Volunteer Fire 

Department equipment was 
needed at the swimming pool to 
help with the preparations for the 
opening of the pool for the 
summer. Four members of the 
department were on hand to help 
"washdown" the pool for paint-
ing. Fire Chief Daryl Snelgrooes, 
Steve Walker and Riley Atwood 
are shown in the pool with 
councilwoman Berniece Hall. 
Mark Frankenberry was oper- 

Thank You 

ating the truck. Frank Clymer, 
city employee, was working at 
the time the picture was taken, 
but he is not shown. June 1 is the 
goal for opening the pool, but the 
opening may be delayed due to 
rain preventing the completing of 
the painting. The pool will be 
managed this year by Gwen 
Cornett. Life guards will be Judy 
Moore and Tammy Moore. 

Pool Phone Number will be 
826-3342. 

The Cheerleaders of Mobeetie 
High School would  like to thank 
everyone who supported the car 
wash. We would appreciate your 
support in the future. 

T. 
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-STUDENTS, TEACHERS 
1933, 1943, 1953, 1963, and 1973. 
There will be a person from each 
of these honored classes relating 
events and memories of their 
high school days. 

A letter notifying ex-students 
and teachers of the reunion was 
sent in April to all whose 

addresses were available with 
the exception of local exes. The 
letter was carried in the paper 
and local exes were to fill out the 
form and return it. If you haven't 
done so, please fill out the form 
in last weeks TIMES, and return 
it. 
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EDITORIAL 
This past weekend a sery tragic reality was 

discovered at the Wheeler cemetery. This sacred 

area was the target of vandals. 

A cemetery Is meant to be a peaceful final 

resting place for departed loved ones. This 

should be the last place one would find 

destruction and vandalism. What sick mind 

could destroy tombstones? Stones were found 

broken, urns destroyed and several pieces of 

stones are missing. Are these people so callous, 

so cruel, to inflict such damage on an area so dear 

to our hearts? 

Hopefully the persons responsible for this sad 

atrocity will realize how damaging this act was 

and not attempt it again. For the damage runs 

far deeper than the physical act. The emotional 

damage to the people who had loved one's graves 

destroyed, is far worse. 

Any further vandalism should carry a very 

severe punishment. 

of accident victims and band-
aging and splinting. 

It was first intended to offer 
both an ECA course and EMT--
Emergency Medical Technician-
-course; this has been changed, 
however, due to the time factor 
and the EMT course will be 
offered at a later date. 

The ECA course involves 40 
hours classroom instruction. 
This will include 1 1/2  hours 
lecture and 11/2  hours practice ( 
weeks. At the end of the course , 

	HoLD REuNioN sA  
skills each week for a period of 13 

students •will be tested with a 
written test and application of 
skills. Certificates are awarded 
upon successful competeing of 
the course; these are good for a 
period of 2 years at which time a 
refresher course ECA is re-
quired. The completion of the 
course qualifies you to work with 
the local volunteer ambulance 
service. 

This will also be an opportunity 
for ECA's and EMT's whose 
certificates are about to expire to 
renew. 

The North Wheeler County 
Volunteer Ambulance Service 
will sponsor a course offering 
Emergency Care Attendant cer-
tificates. The class is open to 
anyone interested learning how 
to treat victims of heart attack or 
accident. The students will learn 
CPR, care of accident victims, 
and bandaging and splinting . 

Those interested in the course 
are asked to meet at the Ambu-
lance Barn at 300 Alan L. Bean 
Blvd. in Wheeler on Thursday 
morning, May 31, at 8:00. It had 
been planned •to hold the class' 
earlier in the year and meetings 
were held to determine interest. 
It is hoped these same people are 
interested and additional indi-
viduals are welcome. 

There is no charge for the 
course and books will be furn-
ished. 

Benefits of taking the classes 
for personal knowledge include 
the learning of CPR--the action 
taken when a person suffers 
complete heart failure, the care 

Americam Cancer Society 
Expresses Appreciation 

r1k 

Wheeler Ex-Students and 
Teachers Reunion has been set 
for Saturday, June 9, 1979, with 
registration beginning at 10:00 
a. m. 

Plans indicate this bi-annual 
affair will again be a success, but 
again local citizens are urged to 
pay their dues and plan to attend 
A number of people will travel 

across the country to attend this 
reunion, and it certainly looks 
bad when ex-students who live a 
few miles away are not in 
attendence. 

Activities for the day will be 
numerous. Registration and 
visitation will begin at 10:00 and 
continue through 12 noon at the 
school. The program will begin 
at 1:30 p.m. with a business 
meeting following. The evening 
meal will be barbecue; you will 
pay for the meal at the door. 

The classes to be honored this 
year are the classes of 1923, 
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Wheat Field Day 
At Twitty Friday 

This new 6.000 sq. ft. building 
on 152 in Mobeetie will be the 
home of Langley's Service and 

Supply and Langley's Restau- Saturday, June 2. 	Langley's 
rant. Grand Opening for Lang- Restaurant is scheduled to open 
ley's Service and Supply will be June 15. 

LANGLEY TO HAVE GRAND OPENING SAT., JUNE 2 

The American Cancer Society 
has just experienced another 
successful residential drive and 
Bike-A-Thon. The success of 
both events has been due to the 
efforts of many people including 
students. The ACS can never 
express enough thanks and ap-
preciation to those people who 
have helped make this years 
events successful. 

The success we have in cancer 
drives gives some assurance to 
continued research toward the 
elimination of cancer in your life -
time. We are all involved one 
way or another. The ACS would 
like to express special thanks to 
the following people who helped 
with the residential crusade. 

Novella Vanpool, Grace Porter, 
Ruby Lee Sandifer, Mac Nash. 
Rita Smith, Jay Kimmard, Wade 
Bentley, Mary Wofford, Angela 
Williams, Teresa Martin. Don 

offer good. home cooked meals 
for the whole family. 	The 
emphasis will be on good food 
and a clean operation. 	The 
restaurant is divided to offer a 

CLINIC Firearms Training 
Course For Ladies 

"The Followers' To 
Be In Mobeetie 

Wheat producers in Wheeler 
County are invited to a wheat 
field day. Friday, June 1 from 
1:00 - 3:00 p.m. on the Richard 
Hefley Farm northwest of Twiny. 
To reach the demonstration plots 
go 2 miles north of Twitty, then 1 
mile west on the county road, 
then % miles north. Turn in at 
the 2nd house on the east side of 
the road. 

Dr. Frank Petr, Area Agron-
omist with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, will be at the 
plots to discuss the various wheat 
varieties. 

This field day will give farmers 
an opportunity to see 20 wheat 
varieties, 2 rye varieties and 
triticale grown under local con-
ditions. 

RAINFALL 

Smith, Hope Coffman, Misha 
Patterson, Renee' Hoguc, Julie, 
Hogan, Becky Crockett, Teresa 
Williams, Shawna Hampton, Lori 
Lee. Kristi Baker, Terry Hutchi-
son, Vida Brown, Doraeen Owen, 
Berniece Hall, Bonnie Lightfoot, 
Elva Wood, Sherri Shelton, Son-
ya Hill, Esther Hill, Scott 
Wright, Billy Westmoreland, 
Deidre Watson, and Mrs. Louis 
Grayson - Allison Crusade Drive 
Chairman. 

Special thanks to the following 
people who helped with the 
Bike-A-Thon. Beth Brown, An-
gela Atwood, Ernie McGaughey, 
Sheriff's Dept, and Several Mo-
thers. 

The residential Crusade drive 
brought in $656.00. Bike-A-Thon 
$2,000.00, and Memorials 
$281.84. 

Bike-A-Thon Winners, Lori 
Lee - First - with greatest amount 
of money brought in - $196.20. 
Justin Miley - Second Place 
Winner for second greatest a-
mount of money brought in -
194.00. 
Jerry Hogan Family - Third place 
trophy for family participation. 

Special awards to following 
people: Justin Miley - Number of 
sponsors - 58, Lyndon Loyd - 3rd 
amount of money - $162.00 
Lyndol Loyd - 2nd number of 
sponsors - 53, Lori Lee - 3rd. 
number of sponsors - 51, Davey 
Johnson - Most Courageous Rid-
er - First Grade. 

There will be a free Blood 
Pressure Clinic for all Wheeler 
County Residents regardless of 
age, Thursday,. June 7. 1979. It 
will take place in the south end of 
the old Nicholson Memorial Hos-
pital on Canadian Street from 
9:30 - 12:00 a.m. 

This clinic is sponsored by the 
Retired Senior Volunteer Pro-
gram and the Texas Agriculture 
Extension Service. 

Those needing a ride can call 
Mrs. Laura Guthrie at 826-5518. 

Here and There 
Laura Guthrie 

Always after a holiday it is so 
hard to write Here and There. I 
know that scores of my friends 
and neighbors have been on trips 
or had company. But, right off, I 
don't know about it. So I will 
mention only a few. 

I hope everybody that traveled 
the highways looked at the lovely 
country around. I've been to 
Perryton and Canadian. That 
route is so beautiful this time of 
year. The common sandhill bear 
grass is standing proud and full. 
The wild flowers, every color, are 
rioutous. The springtime drive to 
Canadian, to me, is more gor-
geous than the "fall foliage 
tour." 

My family is living in Canadian 
now. I think they will be happy 
there if they ever find proper 
housing. At present they are in a 
Traitor Home. It is a nice place. 
but a family the size of mine, who 
has never lived in like quarters, 
are rather cramped. But give 
them time. They will find 
something else-or learn to take it. 

My grandchildren, Steve and 
Melinda have been with me 
several days, as well as a friend 
of Steves, Dean Horn who lives in 
Perryton. Steve and Dean re-
mained in Canadian Monday. but 
Melinda will stay with me a 
while. 

Harold Loyd Lee and most of 
his family enjoyed an outing at 
Greenbelt Lake on Monday. 
Melinda, my granddaughter, ac-
companied them. She said she 
had fun. 

Clara Holmes of Albuquerque, 
spent several days here with her 
brother. Milton Finsterwald and 
other relatives and friends. She 
returned home on Tuesday. 

Ida Farmer has been host to 
her sister, Mrs. Velma Smith and 
a friend Mrs. Louise Pratt, of 
Lanham, Maryland. and a broth-
er Mr. and Mrs. Julian Caddell of 
Dallas. All of them, including 
Ida. went to Canyon on Thursday 
night, to visit with Ida's son and 
family. the Glen Farmers. 

So many good things come to 
the Clemens who live across the 
street from me. On Sunday they 
had all three of their sons with 
them. They attended Church 
together. There was Bryan. from 
Indiana, Dwaine from Delto Col-
orado, and David from Amarillo. 
Their daughter-in-laws Amy and 
Debbie were here. 
A son-in-law, Rex Newkirk. of 
Delta was here Monday and 
Tuesday. He will visit some 
relatives in Shamrock then make 
a wide tour of the South Plains 
(professionally, I'd say) and re- 
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Gospel Meeting 
At Allison Church 

Ronald Gudgel 
Makes Honor Roll Election Hite 

A Gospel Meeting at Allison 
Church of Christ. 	Begins 8 
o'clock p.m. Friday June 1st 
goes through Sunday night at 6 
o'clock p.m., the preacher will be 
Dee Teel from Wayne Okla. 
Everyone is invited to attend. 

private dining room for groups. 
businesses, or organizations to 
meet. Everything is new; the 
equipment in the kitchen is being 
installed with booths, tables and 
chairs scheduled for delivery in 
the near future. 	"Guests can 
feel free to open the doors to the 
kitchen and look in at anytime; 
that's how clean we plan to keep 
it," commented Langley. 

Langley has been in business 
in Mobeetie for the past 3 years. 
He began selling the lawn and 
garden equipment and realized 
the need for a dependable place 
to get this equipment repaired. 
"Service after the Sale." is 
offered. They repair all makes 
and models, regardless where 
you made the purchase. if the 
part doesn't happen to be in 
stock, it won't take long to have 
it. 

Self-Service Gas will be avail-
able very shortly and a little later 
in the summer a fruit and 
vegetable stand will be opened in 
one part of the building. Plenty 
of paved parking is available. 

The latest addition to the city 
of Mobeetie is a 6.000 sq. ft. 
building east of the caution light 
on 152. The structure will house 
Langley's Service and Supply 
and Langley's Restaurant. Car-
roll Langley is the owner and 
manager of the businesses. 
Saturday. June 2 will be the 
Grand Opening for Langley's 
Service and Supply. 	Those 
registering will have an oppor-
tunity to win a new 18" Green-
brier Lawnmower or a McCulloch 
110 Chain Saw. The business 
moved to the new location around 
May 14 before the building was 
completed. 

Langley's will offer a full line 
of lawnmowers and garden til-
lers. The business offers parts 
for all mowers and tillers and has 
a mechanic on duty to keep the 
equipment in top shape. The 
firm will also continue to offer 
Paymaster seed. Vance Langley 
will be working with his dad in 
the shop. 

June 15 has been set for the 
opening of Langley's Restaurant. 

When completed Carroll will 

Ronald Gudgel, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Eugene Gudgel of Mobee-

tie, made the Dean's Honor Roll 

with a grade point average of 3.3. 
Ronald is a sophomore attending 
West Texas State University in 
Canyon and is an Animal Science 
Major. 

The Shamrock Police Depart-
ment will sponsor in conjunction 
with Amarillo College and Pan-
handle Regional Planning Com-
mission a firearms training 
course for women. Classroom 
instructions will be held in the JP 
courtroom in the Wheeler County 
Annex Building at 112 West 
Second St. in Shamrock, Friday, 
June 8 from 6:00 p.m. to 10:00 
p.m. Actual firearm training will 
be held Saturday, June 9, from 
9:00 a.m. to 1 p.m. Women 
signed up for this course will be 

required to furnish their own 
handgun plus 50 rounds of 
ammunition. Preferably no aut-
omatic handguns used. There 
will be a $15.00 registration fee 
required. All women interested 
should contact Kelly Locke or 
Lisa Jernigan at the Shamrock 
Police Department by June 7 at 
5:00 p.m. 

Thursday evening at 7:00 
o'clock the First Baptist Church 
in Mobeetie will have as their 
guests "The Followers." an e-
vangelistic singing group from 
Fort Worth. who will sing for 
thirty minutes before the even-
ing's revival services begin. 

Revival Services have been 
going since Sunday with the Rev. 
Jim Scott, pastor of the First 
Baptist Church in Shamrock. 
speaking. Randy Day, Director 
of Music of the First Baptist 
Church in Fritch, is song leader. 

According to the Rev. John 
Hansard, local minister, the e-
vangelistic services will continue 
thru the Sunday Morning Wor-
ship Services. June 3. 

Wheeler has received a gen-
erous amount of moisture during 
the month of May. A rain early 
Wednesday morning (6-7 a.m.) 
left .9 inches in Wheeler. Elva 
Wood, just east of town, reported 
1'/z". 

The rain Wednesday brought 
the official rainfall for the month 
to 3.4". Rainfall was recorded at 
8 other dates during the month 
with the .63 recorded on the first 
day of the month. 

The rainfall for May, 1978, was 
9.62 inches with three recordings 
of more than 2". 

the Wheeler Masonic Lodge 
1099 A.F. and A.M. will meet in 
regular session Monday nice 
June 4, 1979 at 8:00 p.m. for 
election of officers for 1979-1980. 
Refreshments will be served at 
7:00 p.m. All members urged to 
attend and all master mason 
welcome. 
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AT CAPITOL FEDERAL YOUR 
SAVINGS ARE INSURED TO 

$40,000 BY THE 
FEDERAL SAVINGS 

& LOAN INSURANCE CORP. 

AND YOU GET THE MOST 
FOR YOUR MONEY WITH 

MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATES 

9.767% 
Effective annual yield, based on this week's rate of 

9.409% 
Effective 5-31-79t064-79 Stan) minimum, 6 months maturity 

• Certificates must be reinvested upon maturity, at the same interest rate 

to realize annualized yield. 	Federal reoulations require a substantial 
interest penalty for early withdrawal, and prohibit the compounding of interest 

Other offices in: 
Okla. City - 4114 Classen Blvd. 

100 Park Avenue 
Yukon - 	1330 Cornwell 

FSLIC CAPITOL 
FEDERAL 

SAVINGS 
AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

SAYRE 
129 E. Main 
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PARAMOUNT PICTURES PRESENTS 
JOHN TRAVOLTA KAREN LYNN GORNEY 

"SATURDAY NIGHT FEVER' 
A ROBERT STIGWOOD PRODUCTION 

Saeenpiay by NORMAN WEXLER 
Directed by JOHN BADHAM 

Executive Producer KEVIN McCORMICK 
Produced by ROBERT STIGWOOD 

oromitmac wneenindperkeined try the NE GEES  
Sonia Sr nit* co P50 Fircatis 	...... 

pima to (Sten Pwortack A r*. Jrn" P.A.t, 

PG Purrat Ora 	Mr 	cam i'-..311  

SHOWTIME 8:00 P.M. 
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REGISTER: 18" GREEN BRIER 

LAWN MOWER 
and a 

McOJLLOCH 110 

We invite you in to see our 
New Building on Highway 152 
in Mobeetie 

Langley's Service It Supply 
offers a complete line of Lawnmowers, Tillers It Paymaster Seeds. 

Our shop offers repairs & parts for all makes of mowers It tillers. 

CHAINSAW 
to be given away 

Saturday, June 2 

Register Before 2:00 Sat. 

Langley's Restaurant at the same location 
will open June 15. We will specialize in good, clean, home cooked 

meals for the whole family! 

a 

weighed 5 pounds 	and 5 
ounces and is 19 in. long. 
She was born at Shamrock 
Hospital. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Green 
of Allison. Maternal grand-
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny McKay of Elk City, 
Oklahoma. 

Mr. Ed Walker was a dinner 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Green of Allison. 

Juanita Boydston 

Our Allison News Reporter, 
Mrs. Edith Levitt is retiring 
and I will try gathering the 
new's for a while. I will need 
everyone's cooperation to do 
as well as Mrs. Levitt has done 
the past several years. We 
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ROGUE 
TIENTRF 

1806 826 3078  

ONE WEEK JUNE 12 7 

Gertrude Hill in Shamrock Sun-
day. 

Thursday Mrs. Lee Kiker and 
Mrs. Beulah Reed shopped in 
Pampa. Mr. and Mrs. Lee Kiker 
and Beulah Reed were in Amar-
illo Tuesday on business. 

Shot, Texas, and Tom Child-
ress were dinner guest of Mrs. 
Bill Miller Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roma Brown of 
Clinton. Oklahoma and SaRita 
Boydston were Sunday dinner 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. W.H. 
Boydston. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Chap-
man and Randy. Bret and Nei-
mah were dinner guest of the Roy 
Morse's. Neimah is just out of 
the Shamrock hospital. Mr. and 

Continued Pane 5 

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Gilmer 
and Johnnie Harrison visited 
awhile Sunday evening in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Gilmer. 

Mr. and Mrs. James White 
called the John Gilmers and 
reported a nice week's vacation 
in Hawaii. 

Mr. and Mrs. C.E. Steen and 
Bart of Oklahoma City were 
weekend guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
John Glisan. 

Alene Hall visited the Bruce 
Harrison's awhile Saturday. 

Mrs. Beulah Reed from 
Smithsville, Texas is visiting her 
brother Lee Kiker and Mrs. 
Kiker for awhile. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Kiker and 
Mrs. Beulah Reed visited Mrs. 

Mr. Ed walker was a dinner 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. Eddy 
Walker and Family. Linda 
Carengie and James Lyn and 
Jeannie Walker visited in the 
evening a while. 

Mr. and Mrs. Zeland Rainey 
visited Foy Johnson in Deming 
New Mexico recently. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Dyer, 
Danette and Scott, Mr. and 
Mrs. Winston Rainey and Mr. 
and Mrs. Les Seamster were 
dinner guest with Mr. and 
Mrs. George Parker Sunday. 

Over night guest in the 

appreciate her time and effort 
that she put out. 

Susie Lohberger and Suz-
anne left Friday morning and 
flew from Amarillo to Dallas 
from there to New York and 
then flew on to Rome Italy. 
They are to be touring six 
other different country's be-
fore returning home. Sounds 
like a great vacation. 

Rev. and Mrs. Virgil Cornwell. 
Rusty, Randy and Ricky, journ- 
eyed to DeLeon Thursday even-
ing for a family gathering at her 
mother's Mr. and Mrs. R. D. 
Walker's. 

Mr. and Mrs. Red Dukes, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Hayes 
and family, Clyde Jr. Dukes, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
McMillion of Tulsa were Mon-
day visitors in the Archie 

U-U Electrical Service 
"We handle all your electrical needs" 

ri.:SIDE!":TIAL, COMMERCIAL and CUST0,1 

Robert and Laura Underwood, Owners 

Sox 269 	Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Call Day or Night: 826-3150 

If no answer — 845-2442 

Dillon Home. 

Mrs. Collie Donaldson and 
children spent Thursday and 
Friday with Mrs. Edith Don-
aldson. 

Mrs. Ed Walker and Linda 
Carengie were in Amarillo 
Wednesday for Jeanette Hul-
se's Graduation. They visited 
Pam Carengie also and arrived 
home Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Miller 
have been in Raton, New 
Mexico for a rest and relax-
ation and also attended the 
races while there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Hall 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Hall and family and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Hall and family, 
were dinner guests in the 
home of Mrs. Nona Hall. 

The Carl Giddens went to 
Buena Viesta Colorado to a 
wedding and a graduation over 
the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Green 
are the proud parents of a new 
baby girl, born May 27 at 

12:01 P.M. Jennifer Lynn 
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SHEET & PILLOW CASE 
SALE 

Thursday, Friday 

& Saturday Only 

IT IS 
NOW 

RATED PG 
Because 
we want 

everyone to see 
John Travolta's 
performance... 

Because 
we want 

everyone to catch 
`Saturday Night Fever' <5XgcA ti6 

e90c3taiQ 
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"TULIP TIME" no-iron percale 

!sheets at sale prices — create a 
beautiful bedroom with these 
sunny blooms in Butter Yellow and 
Petal Pink. 

SATURDAYNIGHT 
-44•FEVER3 /44.*, 

Rock Garden & 
"DIAMOND ROSE" no-iron er- 
cale sheets at sale prices 

FASHION SOLID COLORS — NO IRON PERCALE 

TWIN SHEETS 	4.99 KING SHEETS 	10.99 
FULL SHEETS 	5.99 PILLOW CASES 	4.29 ti  

'AJEEN SHEETS 	8.99 KING PILLOW CASES 4.990 

home of Mr. and Mrs. Reuben 
May over the weekend were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Begert 
from Canyon, Dean Leib and 
family from Stinnett, Mr. and 
Mrs. Edwin Begert and 
daughters from Amarillo. 

On Sunday several from the 
community and others visited 
the Reuben May's: 	Mrs. 
Beulah Reed, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Kiker, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarence Zybach, Doris New-
some, Edith Levitt. Edith 
Donaldson, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Jones. 

Jeff Jones from Phoenix, 
Arizona is spending a few 
weeks here with his grand-
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
Jones. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Ault 
have just moved into their new 
home. 

Saturday night, friends and 
relatives some from Erick and 
Oklahoma City, Okla. Help 
celebrate Bret Begert's eighth 
birthday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hiram Begert. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Begert 
of Umberger visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Hiram Begert Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Hulse, 
Bill Henderson from Houston 
and Neal Boydston were din-
ner guest in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clifton Boydston and 
family, Sunday. 

Mr and Mrs. Tommy Hayes 
and family of White Face and 
Doug and Bessie Crenshaw of 
Shamrock were Monday guest 
of Mr. and Mrs. Red Dukes. 

Sunday dinner guest of Mr. 
and Mrs. Red Dukes were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Dukes, 
Mr and Mrs. Clyde Jr. Dukes, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Hayes and children of White 
Face. 

Weekend guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Elmore were: Mr. and Mrs. 
John Bowman and family of 
Fredrick. Okla. Junior and 
Sharon Bowman of Leveland, 
Texas, Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Elmore and family and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Giddens, and 
Kent Hall of Briscoe. 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles 

George of Pampa, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Elliott of Pampa, 
Alan Lane of Miami, Mr. and 
Mrs. Junior Miller of Allisor 
and Mr. and Mrs. Leon Lam 
were weekend guest of Mr. anc 
Mrs. Frank George. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Lane 
visited the Normal Dyers al 
Channing last week. 

• 
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SHURFINE IN GLASS 
APPLESAUCE 	25 JAR  OZ. 59` 
SHURFINE FRUIT 
COCKTAIL 	'CAN. 

A9c —W 
SHURFINE YELLOW CLING HALVES OR SLICES 
PEACHES 	16 CAN  OZ. A9C "'V 
SHURFINE PUNCH-ORANGE-GRAPE 
DRINKS 	2 46 OZ. $ i CANS 
SHURFINE FANCY 
TOMATO JUICE .. 46  CAN  OZ. 69 C 

SHURFINE GOLDEN CREAM STYLE/WH.KERNEL 
CORN 	3170Z. $ i CANS 
SHURFINE GREEN 

!riO, 	SPINACH 	3150AN2. $ i 
CS 

DAIRY VALUES 

SHURFRESH HALFMOON LONGHORN COLBYCHE0DRDAR 

CHEESE ,P  o 0Z
K G  

SHURFRESH QUARTERS 
MARGARINE . . ItT°Nz. 89 SHURFRESH CHEESE 
SPREAD 	2 LB $ 1 99 LOAF 

C 

\' BUTTERMILK 
OR SWEET MILK 

SHURFRESH 
BISCUITS 

8 OZ. 
CANS 

SUMMER 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 

3 1 ,,,ONZS . 89c 
SHURFINE EARLY HARVEST 
SWEET PEAS 	311A°N0S. $1 

SHURFINE CUT GOLDEN RIPE 

ANANAS 

LB. 

GREEN BEANS 

SHURFINE HAMBURGER SLICED DILL 

PICKLES 	 AR 32 OZ. A9C 
J 	glff 

SHURFINE FREE RUNNING OR IODIZED 
SALT 	22B6O0ES 39` 
SHURFINE PURE VEGETABLE 

8oz SHORTENING 	4 CAN 1 69 
 SHURFINE SPECIAL BLEND 

TEA BAGS 	100 CT $ 49 BOX 
SHURFINE EVAPORATED 
MILK 	 '&0N0S 77 

3 LBS $i  • 

iv‘ 94  CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 
ORANGES 	 
NEW CROP SWEET 
ONIONS 	Z LBS 29` CALIFORNIA GOLDEN 
CARROTS 	LB. 25c SHURFINE DINNERS 

MACARONI & CHEESE.47E;OxoE ZS $ 

CAMBRIDGE OR MARIA GRANDE ELEGANT 
SALAD FORK 

EACH 
33c WITH 53.00 PURCHASE 

raw' 

energy 
	

ENERGY CHARCOAL 

BRIQUETS 10 LB. 
BAG  

SHURFRESH BONELESS SECTIONED HALF  OR FORMED 

FROZEN FOODS 

SHURFINE FROZEN 
CORN ON COB 	4 PKG.  EAR  69`
SHURFINE FROZEN 
ORANGE JUICE .'CAN my 

. Lip 
SHURFINE FROZEN NON DAIRY 
CREAMER 	4 16 O  TNZ. $i 

. 

SHURFINE FROZEN SPEARS 
BROCCOLI 	10 0 TN0 C. 39` 
SHURFINE FROZEN CRINKLE CUT 	

PKG 69` POTATOES 	32 OZ 
SHURFINE FROZEN GLAZED 
DONUTS 	'BOX 69` 
SHURFINE FROZEN BATTER DIPPED 
FISH FILLETS 	 

SHURFRESH SLICED 

BACON 

1 LB. 

$129 
2 LB. PKG.  

PKG.  
SHURFRESH BEEF BOLOGNA OR 
FRANKS 

99 
	

12 OZ. 09 
POG 

12 OZ.99 C  PEG. 

ICE 
CREAM 

SHURFRESH 
QUALITY 

99` HAMS. 

YOUR THRIFTWAY STORES SELL 8. FEATURE ONLY FINE QUALITY AMERICAN GROWN GRAIN FED BEEF, FRESH PORK 8. QUALITY POULTR'L 

SHURFRESH MEAT BOLOGNA OR 
FRANKS 

TOTAL GROCERY SAVERS 

SHURFRESH PORK 	 SHURFRESH CHICKEN OR 
$SAUSAGE 	LB.  99c HAM SALAD 	8 OZ. 139 c CTN. SHURFINE REGULAR OR DIET ASSORTED 

6 OZ. 79C PKG 	CHEESE 

PSIMEIENTSOPOR JRALAEPENO 
mE.BR0 0  NMF1  

:...:.::'SOFT DRINKS 7 12 OZ. 
CANS 	

SHURFRESH LUNCHEON BOLOGNA/P&P LOAF/ 
SALAMI/SPICED 

MEATS LUNCHEON LOAF/ 

pfek, 
40, 60 CT. 

PKG. 

S9c  
19c 

SHELF SPECIALS 

SHURFINE SALAD 
DRESSING SHURFINE KITCHEN 
TALL BAGS 	

 $71: 

BOX 
SHURFINE BATHROOM 2 PLY ASSTD. 
TISSUE 	8 ROLL $1 39 PKG. 

FROM OUR SHELVES 

SHURFINE MIXED 
VEGETABLES 	3 160Z $1 CANS 
SHURFINE WHOLE PEELED 
TOMATOES 	3 16 OZ CANS 
SHURFINE WATER OR REG. PAK LIGHT 
CHUNK TUNA 	6'6,014Z. 69` 

II? CEPS 
0 

SHURFRESH PLAIN OR FOR DIPS 

POTATO C HIPS 8 OZ. 
TWIN PAK 

SHURFINE 1 PLY ASSORTED PAPER 

NAPKINS 
SHURFINE TOMATO SHURFINE POWD. ALL PURPOSE OR BLUE 
CATSUP 	3B L. OZ. 79` 

	

. 	 DETERGENT 	4B BOXOZ  
SHURFINE PURE PREPARED 
MUSTARD 	96 AR ,0z 69c AN J 

T F T 

SHURFINE CRUNCHY OR CREAMY 
PEANUT BUTTER 
SHURFINE WHOLE  SWEET    
PICKLE 

KING JAMES VERSION OF THE NEW TESTAMENT 
NO. 8 TAPE 
EACH $ 2 2 9 WTIH S3 00 PURCHASE 

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 

49c 

7 , o OZ BAGS 89` 

I PRICES EFFECTIVE MAY 27-JUNE 2,1979 1 

WE GIVE ... S&H 
GREEN STAMPS! 
Double on Wednesday! 

SHURFINE RATION HIGH PROTEIN 
DOG FOOD 	 
SHURFINE SALTINE 
CRACKERS 

SHURFINE 
BLEACH 	6 OZ JUG 
ENERGY CHARCOAL 
LIGHTER 	32 OZ CAN 

'JAC  V 89c 
22 OZ 89C JAR 

99` 

49` 

69` 

SHURFINE PIECES 8. STEMS 
MUSHROOMS 
SHURFINE STRAWBERRY 
PRESERVES SHURFINE VANILLA 
WAFERS 9 moz. 
	 an PKGS. 79C  

18 OZ 
	 JAR 

4 OZ 
	 CAN 

89c 

25 LB 4,  BAG /
129 SHURFINE BLACK 

PEPPER 	4 OZ A9C CAN Ildr 

2  16  00ES  9 BOX
SHURFRESH MARSHTMASLLOW 



CAKES 
CATERING SERVICE FOR 
Wedding & Anniversaries 

Cathy Hunt-826-3298 
Kav Luttrell— 375-2385 

Also Cakes for all Occasions 

t.  WATERLESS COOKWARE. 
Home demonstration kind. 
Never Opened. $175. Normally. 
5400-5500. 1-303-591-1331. 	4tp 

EXPERIENCED 

TYPIST 
Would like part-time typing —
will do at my home. Regular 
or statical. 

Suzanne Sandifer 
Phone 826-5980 

Mobile Home For Sale: 14'x68' 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, appliances, 
12'x18' storage building, under-
pinning, porches, 4-ton central 
air-conditioning. Van Baize, 
806/826-5686. 	 2tc 

FOR RENT: Small 2 bedroom 
house, Mobeetie — $135.00 a 
month. 	Phone: 256-2049 or 
256-3092. 	 2tc 

Tommy Bolin, MASONRY CON- 
TRACTOR, 	Pampa, Texas, 
665-6217, or Wheeler, 826-5259. 

6tp 

Registered Thoroughbred 
Stallion "Ditto" 

Grand size Nasrullah standing 
at Dan Yarbrough Stallion 
Station, Shamrock, Texas, Call 
806-256-2828 for details. 	6tc 

REWARD 
LOST: Female Irish Setter bet- 
ween Canadian and Wheeler off 
Waterfield Ranch. 	Has Red 
Leather Collar. 	 ltc 

NORMAN BENTLEY 

WELDING & 
BACKHOE 
24 Hour Service 

-FULLY INSURED - 

801 826-5247 

Wheeler, Texas 

The Cattleman's 

Feed Service 

LOOMIX 
Since 1905 

Liquid Feed Supplement 

°Natural Protein 
*Highest Energy 
• Consuintion Control 
• Fully Patented 

TED NELSON 
'none: 821-55e 

PUPPIES TO GIVE AWAY: part 
cow dog and German Sheppard. 
Phone: 826-5275 after 4:00. 	3t 

FOR SALE 
Something Special Gift Shop 

605 W. Oklahoma 
Wheeler, Texas 

Inventory — priced at below 
wholesale cost; Florist & 
Dealers welcome to 	our 
wholesale prices. 

See our many new items 

The Cheerleaders will paint your 
House Number on your curb. 
$3.00 charge. Phone 826-5534. 

CLASSIFIED RATES 
4411 classified ass must be paid 

in advance, except for open 
ledger account coustomers. 

Charges are 1 lc per word. 
Minimum charge is $1.10, 

Card of thanks charges will be 
$2.25. 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds ... 5:00 p.m. Monday 
Display 	5:00 p.m. Monday 

Wheeler Lodge No. 1099 

A. F. & A.M. 

MONDAY 
7:00 P.M. 
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Want Ads 
—Ins 	a_ 

Court Records 
2 RDT--Federal Land Bk of 
Houston to C H Sammons et al 
5-9-79 Land not set out 

	

I

Burns and Associates, 	Inc 
11-21-79 Pt Secs 44, 45 A-4 
DT--Jesse H Stepps et ux to 

	

Burns and Associates, 	Inc 
11-21-79 Pt Secs 44, 45 A-4 

Boydston et ux to United States 
of Amer 4-15-79 NE% 2 Blk RE 
MD--A W Burrell to Opal Bonet! 
5-21-79 3 ac int SE'/. Sec 27 Blk $ 
A-8 
MD--Dudley V Miller et ux to 
Mike Honeycutt 5-21-79 10 ac int 
S1/2  Sec 12 Blk 1 B&B Sur 
ROY D--Dudley V Miller et ux to 
A W Burrell 5 21-79 20 ac int 51/2  
Sec 12 Blk 1 B&B Sur 
MD--Dudley V Miller et ux to A 
W Burrell 5-21-79 20 ac int S1/2  
Sec 12 Blk 1 B&B Sur 
C/C PROBATE--Roger H Brum-
ley 5-7-79 Lots 2, 3, 4 Blk 31 
Shamrock 
AOL--Shenandoah Oil Corp to 
Nicor Exploration Co 4-23-79 Pt 
Secs 11, 30 A-4; Pt 41 A-S 
OL--Sharon R Bragg et al to 
Chevron USA Inc 1-5-77 W1/2  
N% E1/2  NE% 46 A-7 
OL--Robert M Weger et ux to 
Minco Oil and Gas Co 3-27-79 320 
ac Sec 30 Blk A-4 
C/C P OF ATTY--Thomas H 
Lamb to Alta Lou Richards 
3-12-79 
STIP--Martha Ann Stanlee Helton 
et al to Neta Inet Standlee Evans 
4-26-79 W1/2  Sec 65 M-1 
D--Scott C Rowe et al to Reed 
Grogan 4-27-79 W1/2  & SE% 57 
Sec 58 Blk 23 exc mins 
D--Reed Grogan et ux to Marilyn 
Nelson et al 4-11-79 SE% 73 Pt 
74, NE'/. 57 exc 4.64 ac & Exc 
Mins 
STIP--Reed Grogan et al to Scott 
C Rowe et al 5-4-79 MINS 57, 58, 
74, SE% 73 Blk 23 
OL--Lloyd Esmond Adams et ux 
to R C Callan 5-4-79 NW' Sec 63 
Blk 13 
MAY 22, 1979 
RDT--First Bank & Trust Sham-
rock to D V Brashears et ux 
5-21-79 75'x90' Blk LXII Sham-
rock 
D--D V Brashears et ux to Billy 0 
Don Bonner et ux 5-21-79 S 75' N 
150' E 100' Blk LXII Shamrock 
DT--Billy Don Bonner et ux to 
United States of America 5-21-79 
S75' N150' E100' Blk LXII Sham-
rock 
DIV ORDER--M M Giles et al to 
C B Blackwell et al 5-17-79 S1/2  
Sec 63 Blk 24 
DIV ORDER--Margaret E Goe-
mans to Margaret E Goemans 
5-11-79 Sec 94 Blk 13 
DT--Robert H Wendle to Bk of 
the SW Amarillo 5-17-79 N1/2  
SE% Sec 53 Blk A-8 
MAY 23, 1979 
MML--Rodney Weatherly et ux 

Continued Page 6 

ROW--Allen M 	Reynolds to 
Southwestern Public Sery Co 
5-21-79 Pt Sec 25 Camp Co Sch 
Ld 
RMML--City of Wheeler to T L 
Gunter 5-9-79 W50 ft Lots 6 to 10 
Blk C Wheeler Park Ad 
ASSIGN INCOME--Clifton W 

HELP WANTED 

WAITRESS WANTED: Apply at 
Sparlin's Restaurant. 	rtp 

LADY VENUS: Aloe Vera CoS-
metic's now available at the City 
Cleaners & Fabrics. Call for frte 
,facial and skin treatment. 82b- 
3268. 	 rtn 

LIST OF INSTRUMENTS FILED 
IN THE OFFIEC OF THE CO-
UNTY CLERK AND DISTRICT 
CLERK OF WHEELER CO-
UNTY, TEXAS FROM MAY 21 
THROUGH MAY 25, 1979 
MAY 21, 1979 
7 OLs--Joe Harlan et al to 
Diamond Shamrock Corp 3-7-79 
NW% Sec 48 Blk A-5 
ROW--Marilyn Grogan Nelson et 

SI 

NOTICE 
The Wheeler Public Library is 

searching for a replacement as 
librarian because Lana Brad-
street, the present librarian is 
moving. 

Applicants should have at least 
30 hours of college credit and be 
able to drive to Amarillo occas-
ionally for meetings. Place your 
name with Bob Roark, Anita 
Brown or Roberta Adams. 

al to Diamona Shamrock Corp 
1-6-79 SW% Sec 58 Blk 23 
OL--James W Hughes et ux to 
Stahl Petroleum Co 5-8-79 SW'/. 
Sec 67 Blk 17 
D--R G Russ Jr et ux to Philip R 
Russ et al 5-18-79 Lot 6 Blk 20 
Wheeler 
ROW--Mary Ann Gill et al to 
Diamond Shamrock Corp 5-5-79 
Pt Sec 30 Blk 23 
AFF--E M Stuart et ux to Bobby J 
Edwards 5.9-79 Lots 1, 2 Blk 11 
Shamrock PBA 
RVL-RDT--Dalton Honeycutt to 
Mision Bautista Betania 5-18-79 
L 7 to 12 Blk XV Shamrock 
DT--Mision Bautista Betania to 
First Natl Bk of Memphis 5-15-79 
COR D--Vita Gordon Beavers to 
Bobby Edwards 12-18-79 Blk 
XLIII & Lots 11 to 24 Blkxliv 
Shamrock 
TMML-TDT--Burns and Associ-
ates Inc to Western Natl Bk of 
Amarillo 4-10-79 Pt E1/2  45 Pt 
W1/2  Sec 44 Blk A-5 
MML--Jesse H Stepps et ux to 

Phone: 806/826-5S10 
or 826-5942 

West 12th Street 

HOLCOMB 

TRAILER PARK 

Addressers Wanted IMMEDI-
ATELY! Work at home — no 
experience necessary — excel-
lent pay. Write American Ser-
vice, 8350 Park Lane, Suite 127, 
Dallas, TX 75231. 	 4tp 

Tull or Part TiMb RN's Needed to 
Rotate Shifts. Excellent salary, 
retirement, fringe benenis. 
Hemphill Co. Hospital. Canadian 
Texas, Call Collect the Director 
or Assistnat Director of Nursing, 
802/323-6422. Equal opportunity 
Employer. 

COOKS & WAITRESSES 
WANTED 

'faking applications for cooks 
and waitresses. 2 shifts open 6 
a.m. to 10 p.m. Contact Carroll 
Langley, 845-2611, Mobeetie, 
Texas. 	 2tc 

NOW! 
An Opportunity For 

Industrial Sales 
An opportunity for an industrial-commercial 
sales rep to earn bigger margins. 

Cut out the middleman and enjoy factory direct 
privileges as one of our company appointed 
distributors. Represent a line of unique, proven, 
concentrated products that sell in bulk sizes 
and build repeat business backed by proven 
sales methods, tools and training. Start part-
time or full-time. Act now for priority consid- 
eration

. HOWARD & SUNNY HILL 
Wheeler, Texas 

806'826-5540 
Independent Conklin Distributor 

Conklin Company, Inc. 4' FREE WINDBREAKER with 
RCA Console T. V. while they 
last. L..& F. Repair. 	rtn 

TREES 
TREES TRIMMED, Odd jobs 
done, reasonable rates, the 
fixit man. Phone: 826-5783. 

3mth 
OIL AND GAS LEASES 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY 

	 MEMBER 	  
OIL NEWS 

1 am interested in buying your 
OIL AND GAS LEASES,' MIN-
ERALS and ROYALTY. Gene 
Hall, Minco Oil and Gas Co., Box 
2317, Pampa, Texas 79065. 
Phone: 669-6805. 	 rtn 

OIL & GAS LEASES 
am interested in leasing your 

Oil & Gas Leases, also purchas- 
ing your Minerals & Royalty. 

R. C. Callan 
Box 7473 Amarillo, Texas 79109 

Phone: 806-352-7891 

FOR SALE: 14 cows Brangus & 
White face, one bull and 2 calves. 
Dwight Erwin, 826-5812 	4tp 

FOR SALE: 6 Registered Char-
lois Bulls. Virgil Simmons, 
Phone: 826-5843. 	 rtn 

Dinner Theatre 
A laughing look at parenthood 

-- and even grandparenthood -- is 
in the spotlight at Amarillo's 
Country Squire Dinner Theatre 
with production of "My Daugh-
ter's Rated 'X'. "now on stage 
Tuesdays through Saturdays. 
The parental quandry isn't all 
laughter. It has its serious 
moments. The comedy poses the 

question of how to successfully 
rear offsprings in a conventional 
mold and at the same time have 
understanding for some of their 
"new ideas." Playing roles of a 
father and a mother whose 
daughter comes back home to 
live, bringing along the couple's 
first grandchild, are James Slau-
ter and Pamela McCormick. 
Gare Brundidge is cast as the 

equally astonished and confused 
"other" grandfather. "My 
Daughter's Rated 'X' " will run 
through mid-June at Country 
Squire, located at 1-40 and 
Grand. Buffet dinner service 
begins at 6:30 p.m. Country 
Rogue entertainment is sched-
uled for 8 p.m. with comedy time 
at 8:30 p.m. Thickets may be 
purchased for "show only." 

TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION • 

INTENTIONS TO DRILL: 
HEMPHILL - Wildcat - E.T.S. 
Enterprises, Inc. - Fillingim #1 -
1250' f S & 1250' f E lines of Sec. 
44, M-1, H&GN - PD 15.000' 
HEMPHILL - Mendota, 	E. 
(Morrow, Upper) - El Paso 
Natural Gas Co. - Campbell #4 -
467' f S & 467' f E lines of Sec. 
40, 1, H&GN - PD 12,500' 
HEMPHILL - Wildcat - Kerr-Mc-
Gee Corp. - John Vise #1 - 660' f 
N & 2450' f E lines of Sec. 52, 
M-1, H&GN - PD 15,200' 
WHEELER - Wildcat - HNG Oil 
Co. • Britt 7 #1 - 1980' f S & 1980' 
f E lines of Sec. 7, 1, Brooks & 
Burleson - PD 17,500' 
WHEELER - Wildcat - Leede Oil 
& Gas, Inc. - Twitty Gas Unit #2 -
660' f S & 860' f E lines of Sec. 
27, A-8, H&GN - PD 8000' 
COMPLETIONS: 
HEMPHILL - Wildcat - E.T.S. 
Enterprises, Inc. C. W. Barker #1 
- Sec. 53, M-1, H&GN - Comp. 
5/3/79 - Pot. 32,000 MCF/D -
Perfs. 14,388' - 14,356' - TD 
15,016' 
HEMPHILL - Howe Ranch (Hun-
ton) - El Paso Natural Gas Co. -
Gene Howe #5 - Sec. 5, 1, G&M -
Comp. 3/20/79 - Pot. 20,250 
MCF/D - Perfs. 17,555' - 17,568' 
PBTD 17,562' 
HEMPHILL - Alpar (Tonkawa) -
Gulf Oil Corp. - Ora Morris #3-92 
- Sec. 92, 41, H&TC - Comp. 
4/5/ 79 - Pot. 1700 MCF/D -
Perfs. 8326' - 8334' - PBTD 9217' 
WHEELER - Wildcat - C.I.G. 
Exploration, Inc. - Meeks #1041 -
Sec. 41, A-4, H&GN - Comp. 
3/26/79 - Pot. 650 MCF/D - 
Perfs. 15,306' - 15,440' - PBTD 
15,800' 

Published Every Thursday at Wheeler, Texas, By.. .. 

ER 	
\N

-91 \1\  ES  

P.O. Box 1080 
Phone: 826-3123 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 
GARAGE SALE: 307 N. Osage, 
May 31 — June 6. 8:00 to 6:00. 

Entered os second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Subscription Rates: 

Wheeler County 	$6.50 

$7.50 Outside County 	 REWARD 
$200.00 Reward for the return 
of Tool box of Carpenter Tools. 
They have the initial R.G.S. 

and/or 452-94-4690. Contact 
The Wheeler Times, Phone: 
826-3123. 	 rtn 

Septic Tank 
Service 

ROTO ROOTER SERV. 

Cleaning 33, Repairing 

Phone: (405) 

928-3978 
Sayre, Oklahoma 

BARNES 
ELECTRIC 

Refrigeration and 
Appliance Repair 

—All Kinds of Wiring—

Whee ler, Texas 

906/926-5777 

FOR SALE: 1971 El Cameo with 
hull. Phone: 826-5881 or 
826-5204 after 5:00. 	rtn 

FOR SALE: 1958 Model A 
Gleaner Combine. Ready to go. 
Mark Meek, 375-2343. 	2tc 

AUCTION SALE 
Located: 1 block west of Pete Burton Ford, High way west 152. Then North % mile. 

Saturday, June 9, 1979 
10:00 A.M. — Wheeler, Texas 

FURNITURE & HOUSEHOLD ITEMS 

VACUUM CLEANER 
Compact 

Home Care Products 
720 W Ave. D. 

Elk City, Oklahoma 
Area 405-225-3446 

Wildlife Should 
Remain Wild 

•4 

4 

r Several coffee pots and toasters 
1 - Electric skillet 
1 - Mirror matic Presto Cooker 
2 - Iron skillet (antique). 
1 - Maytag cook stove on Butane. 
1 - Large National Cooker 
1 - odd lot of dishes and cooking 

utensils 
1 - 17 cu. ft. Tru-Cold deep freeze 
1 - Maytag automatic washing 

machine (nearly new) 
1 - 2 burner electric hot plate 
1 - set of glass top fruit jars 

(antique) 
Several other antique glass top 
fruit jars 
200 or more mixed fruit jars, 
some with fruit 

1 - Dresser with large minor 
(antique) 
1 - roll away bed. 
1 - large flat top trunk 
1 - large cedar chest 
1 - small flat top trunk. 
Several suitcases 
1 - small flat top trunk. 
1 - old style curling iron 
1 - Vacuum sweeper for car. 
1 - Pie Safe (antique) 
1 - set cotton cards 
1 - breakfast table. 
1 - Coffee talbe. 
1 - medium size refrigerator 
3 - Electric food mixer 
1 sausage mill 
I - set of 3 sad irons (antique). 

WHEELER 
REDI-MIX 

RI.UI MIX C °Mitt_ fF 

SANE) 

Washed Gravel-All Sizes 

Office Hours: 7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 

EQUIPMENT, VEHICLES & MISCELLANEOUS 
I - 8' pick-up camper 
1 - lot shovels rakes, hoes 
1 - 25 or 30 log chains 
Assorted sizes pipe wrenches 
1 - rope wire stretcher - well 

blocks 
1 - lot wrenches - (antique) 
1 - 500 gal. butane tanks - good 

condition 
1 - 4 horse 22" Tru-Test self 

propelled lawn mower - 
nearly new. 

1 - small camper ice box. 
6 - beam cotton scales 
1 - bolt bin 
1 - T.V. Anteana (Farm Bureau 

type) 
1 - Tandeum Trailer - 10' 

Alumi num 
Self-Storing 

Dr. Marion Roberts 

OPTOMETRIST 

Phone: 669-3333 

112 W. Kingsmill 

Pampa, Texas 

STORM-SCREEN 
WINDOWS 

Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable from inside. Easy t 
c lean„prowler•proof. Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills.... 

WH EELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 Wheeler, Tex. 
fine Service for Fine People 

1 - lot of fishing equipment. 
About 600 used bricks 
About 300 conduit pipe 
1 • lot steel traps and hide 

stretchers 
1 - lot of junk iron 
4 - Cast iron cultivator seats 
several others seats 
Several used tires 
1 - lot commodes sinks 
2 - nail kegs 
3 - wash tubs - good.:  
1960 - 4 door sedan car Stude- 
baker - fair condition. 
1958 - 3/4  ton Int pick-up (ready to 

go) 
1 - 1972 3/4  ton Automatic Int. 
pick-up ready to go. 

1 - 71/2 " Circular saw B&P 
(Nearly new) 
1 - 3/8" Trustworthy drill. 
1 - 1/4 " Power - Kraft drill. 
1 - 1/4 " Shapmate drill and 
several bits 
3 - Woods Planes 
6 - Hand Saws other Carpenter 
tools. 
1 - Drawer knife (antique) 
1 - Eureka Vacuum cleaner 
1 - Hand Speed Drill - (antique). 
1 - Electric Remington 12" chain 
saw (nearly new) 
1 - Bench Grinder 
1 - Large assortment hand tools 
1 - Minco cutting torch - complete 

hardly used 

YARD SALE: Friday & Saturday. 
9:00 to 5:00, 1203 S. Alan Bean. 

House Moving 
SPARLINS-821-5898 

'-`heeler, Texas 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 

Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler. Texas 

Percy Farmer, Sec'y. 

Members Urged To Attend. 

Visitors Welcome. 

1 - Hidebed and chair 
1 - Recliner. 
1 - Platform rocker. 
1 - Plain rocker. 
1 - Library table. 
1 - end table (antique) 
1 - Dearborn heater. 
3 • table lamps. 
5 - Cane bottom chairs. 
2 - what not cabinets 
1 - two piece bedroom suite 

complete. 
2 - metal bed stead - complete 
About 15 bed quilts also several 
blanket, sheets and Pillow cases. 
2 - Bath heaters 
6 - straight back chairs 
1 - Chifforobe (antique) 

FOR SALE: 1972 Oldsmobile 
custom curiser, 455 motor and 
factor air, excellent condition. 
Phone: 826-5641. 	 rtn 

LUBBOCK -- This is the time 
of the year when most species of 
young animals and birds are seen 
by people fishing, hiking or 
camping in Texas. Many well-
intentioned persons decide that 
these young species of wildlife 
have been abandoned and take 
them home as a pet. 

"There are several reasons 
these young wildlife should be 
left in the field since it is not only 
illegal but it is always harmful or 
even fatal to the animal itself," 
said David Dvorak, wildlife bi-
ologist. 

"Texas law prohibits confining 
or penning game animals or birds 
and most persons do not know 
how or what to feed the young 
wildlife once it is at their resi-
dence," Dvorak continued. 

Even if the young wildlife 
adapts to the human surround-
ings, they often become danger-
ous to their captors, pets children 
and property when grown the 
biologist continued. 

Young animals are rarely 
abandoned by their parents. 
Most are hidden while the parent 
goes off to feed where it can keep 
a watchful eye on it's offspring.$ 

Many animals and birds are 
natural carriers of disease and 
insects which can become haz-
ardous or even deadly to hu-
mans. The best known examples 
are rabies in skunks and fleas on 
prairie dogs. - 

Most of these cute animals 
have sharp teeth and will bite in 
self-defense. Usually, the young 
children at home are the recip-
ient of these attacks. 

If a person knows the animal is 
orphaned or abandoned, such as 
a road kill, contact the nearest 
Texas game warden or P&WD 
office giving location of the 
animal to be rescued. 

Lunch will be served. 

Not responsible for accidents. 

Clerks: Sharon Miles, Shari Gail 
Porter, Ann Henderson, Collec-
tion Clerks 

Let Me ISrite It 	. . 

GEO. RICHARDSON 

All Types Of 
INSURANCE 

C'JSTOM DRAPERIES 
Swags, Cornices, Shutters 

— WE INSTALL FREE —

Telephone: 256.3652 

Brannons Decorators 
Shamrock, Texas 79079 

Estate of J. Faim' Steen 
Auctioneer: Charles Walser, 	 Assistant: 	Shelby Pettit. 

License No. TXGS-o49-0992. 	 Phone:826-5255, Wheeler, Texas 
Phone 806-665-3142, Pampa, 	 79096 
Texas 79065. 



Pucusso's 
Ceramics & Arts 

105 West Sixth 

WHEELER, TEXAS 

826-3351 
WE ARE SCHEDULING AFTERNOON 
SESSIONS FOR THOSE 8 YEARS AND 

OLDER. 
For more information, please 

contact me. 

Thursday Morning 
ADULT SESSIONS .. . 9-11 A.M. 

Mon. & Thurs. Nights 
ADULT SESSIONS . .. 7-9 P.M. 

ALANA DAUGHTRY, Owner 

• 

t. 	 
Put your money to work right here... 

Helping To Build Wheeler 
...and earn up to 0.33% interest 

(See Table Below) 

"Ore, S.00( 
i  8-Year 

1•1;1111.11* I  Certificate 

6.75% 
2';-Year 

Certificate 

7.50r; 
4-Year 

Certificate 

7.75'; 
6-Year 

Certificate 

6.50% 5.75% ' 
1-Year 	3-Month 

Certificate I Certificate 

1/1111P. I 8.33 
m in '`'sots' 31.000 in  

5.25% 
Passbook 
Savings 

5.39% 
$25 Minimum 

8.06% 
51.000 min, 

7.79% 6.98% 
sum min, 51.000 min, 

6.72% 5.92% 
$1,000 min, 131.000 min, 

Federal retnil.• 
cat FSLIC 

,:ons require a substantial penalty for 
4 withdrawal of certificates. 

•••••“*.v.&•.........n• Co.. 

• ...t..+..,..... Fe ..0O 

Paid from date of 
deposit to date 
of withdrawal— 
no penalty. 

Red River 
Savings C Loan Association 

WE NEED YOUR PASSBOOK AND CERTIFICATES OF nrcol: 
TO FINANCE HOME BUILDING IN WHEELER 

4. 	 

Phone or write: 
P. 0. Box IN Shamrock, Texas 79079 000 266-2172 

1/ 

xwaraaaa30.4.-s—i=a423S..‘110-1.1-‘1,aeik • • 	- e• , . .:aria 3l... 	..••• • 	, 	• • 
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bride, from Amarillo. All of the 
attendents wore black tuxedos, 
white shirts and yellow silk 
boutonnieres. 

Fellowship Hall at the First 
Baptist Church was the scene of 
the wedding reception after the 
ceremony. The bride's table was 
covered with a cloth of white net 
and satin and centered with a 
floral arrangement of daisies and 
spring garden flowers. Table 
appointments were of silver and 

Manning-Laster Vows Pledged 
crystal. 

The wedding cake was three 
tiered, white and decorated with 
a cascade of yellow roses. It was 
topped with a trio of white 
wedding be115, tied with ribbon 
and lace. Yellow  punch was 
served from a crystal punch 
bowl. 

On the grrom's table the 
centerpiece was a picture of the 
bride, a gift to the groom. 
Chocolate cake was served from 
this table and coffee was served 
from a silver service. During the 
reception Sherilyn Walker pro-
vided music. 

Joyce Shipp, of Hereford; Jean 
Chandler, of Wellington; Sharron 
Oden and Vicki Ellis of Lubbock, 

carried a nosegay of white and 
yellow silk roses with baby's 
breath. The satin streamers 
were tied in love knots. 

Mrs. Don (Susan) Manning, 
sister-in-law of the bride from 
Amarilllo was matron of honor 
and Cheryl Brewer. of Dalhart 
was bridesmaid. 	They wore 

identical floorlength dresses of 
blue print, pleated chiffon, and 
carried bouquets of long stem-
med silk roses. 

Johnny Dollar, of Miami, was 
best man and Bill Laster, brother 
of the groom, from Ft. Worth; 
Gary Carey, of Big Spring and 
Don Manning, brother of the 

alternated at the serving table. 
Also, part of the houseparty were 
Kim Formway and Kristen Wal- 
ker, of Clarendon. 	Debbie 
Cooper, of Amarillo presided at 
the guest book. 

For her traveling costume the 
bride selected an ensemble of 
peach skirt and vest with bone 
accessories. 

Upon their return from a 
wedding trip to Puerto Vallarte, 
Mexico, the couple will be at 
home in Abilene at 2450 Glen-
dale, Abilene, Texas. 

Mrs. Laster was graduated 
from Wheeler High School and 
Texas Tech University with a 
B.S. in Home Education. Prior to 
her marriage whe was employed 

by the Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service in Clarendon as a 
County Extension Agent - Home 
Economics. 

Dennis Ray Laster graduated 
from Snyder High School, San 
Angelo State University in San 
Angelo and is the local manager 
of West Texas Utilities Company 
in Abilene. 

Numerous friends and relal 
tives from out of town attended 
the wedding- 

Dr. M. V. Cobb 
CHIROPRACTOR 
Specializing in The 

Examination 4nd 
Treatment of Spinal 

4nd Nervous bisorders 

256-2133 
310 South Main 

SHAMROCK. TEXAS 

LINES from LINDA 
CEA — Linda Daughtry 

ferry Scoggin sang "My tri-
bute" and Jim Laster, brother of 
the bridegroom from Dora. New 
Mexico, sang "The Wedding 
Prayer" following the ceremony. 
The bride and groom lit the unity 
candle at the end of the wedding 
ceremony 

The bride chose a gown of 
sheer white silk organza. fash-
ioned with vee neckline, tapered 
waist and long full sleeves. The 
dress skirt fell to a sweep of 
cathedral train from back full-
ness. Wide bands of enbroidered 
lace with dainty scallops edged 
the neckline and was appliqued 
across the shoulders and waist 
front with pearl detailing at the 
waistline. The same lace was 
appliqued on the dep cuffs and 
around the skirt hem. 	Pearls 
were embroidered at the neck 
and cuffs which were fastened 
with satin covered buttons. 

Following the old tradition of 
'something borrowed, something 
blue' she wore a blue garter, the 
new wedding dress, a borrowed 
slip, and for something old 
carried a handkerchief of her 
great grandmother's. Of course 
there was the 'sixpence in her 
shoe.' 

For her bouquet the bride 

Church of the Nazarene 
Pastor — Harold Wayne Moore 

Sunday School 	10:00 A.M. 
Sunday Worship 	11:00 A.M. 
Sunday Evening 	6:30 P.M. 
Ladies Bible Study 
Thursday 	10:00 A.M. 

Phone: 826-5952 

Cynthia Ann Manning and 
Dennis Ray Laster,were united in 
marriage, on Saturday, May 12, 
1979 at 4 o'clock in the afternoon 
at the first Baptist Church in 
Clarendon. Rev. Dale Cain, 
minister of the Calvary Baptist 
Church in Lubbock officiated at 
the double ring ceremony. 

t 

	

	The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. John L. Manning, 
of Weatherford. Parents of the 
groom are Mr. and Mrs- C. E. 
Laster, of Dunn. 

Triple branched candelabra 
bearing tall white tapers. decor-
ated the altar. A floral arrange-
ment of white blossoms embel-
lished the center one and green-
ery completed the decoration on 

/the two flanking candelabra. 
Large potted ferns were placed 
on either side. 

The bride was escorted by her 
father to the pew where her 
mother rose and joined them as 
they continued to the altar where 
the parents of the groom joined 
in. There the respective parents 
gave their children in marriage. 

% Jessie Adams, organist, pro-
vided pre-nuptial music and 
"Annie's Song" was a vocal duet 
by Terry and Jennifer Scoggin 
while the ushers lit the candles. 

\CUST
OM  HAY SERVICIli' 

_ 
[ 	NORTHWEST OKLAHOMA 

. STORM SHELTER 
& BASEMENT CO. 

CONCRETE SHELTERS & BASEMENTS 	 '..... ..tit 
FAIRVIEW 

405/ 227.4357 

Remove Mildew Before Painting 
Remove all signs of mildew 

from a home before painting -- or 
expect the mildew to "come 
through" the new paint in a few 
days or weeks. 

To remove mildew, use a 
water-based solution of tri-sod-
ium phosphate, chlorine bleach 
and detergent -- readily available 
from paint stores, lumber yards, 
hardware stores and grocery 
stores. 

Chlorine bleach kills mildew 
spores and lifts out stubborn 
stains, while trisodium 	phos- 
phate cleans and "roughs up" 
the original paint surface so new 
paint will adhere. 

Detergent helps clean, too, 
and it keeps the other two 
ingredients in contact with the 
old-paint surface for even more 
effective cleaning action. 
Mildew-Removal Formula 

Here's the formula: 	One 
gallon water, one cup tri-sodium 
phosphate, one cup chlorine 
bleach and one-fourth cup deter-
gent. 
How to Apply 

Apply this solution to the old-
paint surface with a long-handled 
brush that has stiff fiber or 
plastic bristles. Use a vigorous 
rubbing action. 

Wear rubber gloves and other 
protective gear to avoid contact 
with the skin, since the solution 
can cause severe skin irritation. 

4 CUTTING, BALING & 
HAULING 

REGULAR or LARGE ROUND 

D. W. L. E. FORD 
Wheeler, Texas Realty of the Southwest 

•	 
Phone: 806/826-3106 or 

806 326-3275 

Got the Blahs? then change 
your way of living! Try this 
newly remodled, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, with basement, double 
car garage. This energy-ef-
ficient home is an excellent 

buy. (On Contrac t)  
Budget Beater - This dollar 
stretcher is priced to enjoy... 
just right for small family. It 
has 2 bedrooms, cellar, and 
Furnished apartment to help 
pay house payment. 

160 Acres - 5 miles west of 
Shamrock. 

4. 

Start the Summer in the 
terrific 3 bedroom, 13/4  bath. 
full basement, new built-in 
oven, dishwasher, and stock-
ade fence. Very neat and 
clean priced to sell. 
Investment Property - this two 
bedroom home has been re-
carpeted and repainted. A-
long with it goes 3-100x150 
lots. This is good income 
property. 
320 Acres - Wheeler County, 
Magic City area, 3 stocker 
wells, excellent for cattle op-
eration. 

• 
• 
S 
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BUILDING CONSTRUCTION 
COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL 

NEW WORK & REMODELING 
PAINTING & DECORATING 

POLE BARNS — CEMENT WORK 
STOCK TANKS RE-BUILT 
— FREE ESTIMATE — 

Call Pampa: 665-3214 

S 
0 
S 

S 

I 
S 
S 
S 

Mrs. Dennis Ray Laster 

Lot For Sale - 75x150 

WE NEED YOUR LISTINGS! 
John Norman, Broker 
Don Rives, Salesman 

ALLISON From Page 2 

Start at the top of an exterior 
wall and work down. Scrub a five 
- to six - foot area at a time, then 
rinse well with a high-pressure 
nozzle attached to a garden hose. 

Let the cleaned surface dry 
completely before applying new 
paint. Then paint immediately to 
prevent new mildew growth. 
Mildew - Removal Alone 

If mildew removal alone is the 
plan. with no new painting job 
set for the near future, use the 
same solution -- but omit the 
tri-sodium phosphate. Follow the 
same steps and take the same 
precautions, since many persons 
are sensitive to chlorine bleach. 
Mildew - Resistant Paints 

Before applying a new coat of 
paint, consider buying mildew-
resistant paints for the home. 
These are available lall colors for 
outdoor wood surfaces. To help 
combat mildew attack, consider 
paints formulated with fungi-
cides -- such as chlorinated 
phenols, phenyl mercurials, zinc 
compounds or copper 	com- 
pounds. If you choose one of 
these, carefully observe all pre-
cautions on the label, since many 
of the chemicals in mildew -
resistant paints are poisonous. 
Also, instead of buying mildew-
resistant paints, you can buy 
fungicide additives and mix them 
with ordinary paints. Another 
idea is to buy zinc oxide or spar 
varnish and mix it with oil-base 
paint -- to make the paint less 
susceptible to mildew by drying 
the paint to a hard film. 
However, these tend to make 
paint crack and peel, and this can 
pose equally serious problems. 

% 	 ..... 	Alb "lb •111. ..... MIL ith. BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 

Beef processed, double wrapped 	per pound 

lc A Pound for Butchering 

806826-5202—Office 
826-3283—Home 
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Mrs. Roy Morse, Bret and Nei-
mah and the Chapman's journ-
eyed to Amarillo and visited 
Harvey, who is in the High 
Plain's Baptist Hospital. It was 
Harvey's birthday. Floyd Morse 
returned with the Morse's for a 
visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eddy Walker 
and family journeyed to Amarillo 
Monday and went to the Won-
derland Park and also visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Dennis Hulse while 
there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Harrison. 
Vivian Wallace, Louise, Kim and 
Cheryl Boydston had a very 
enjoyable trip flying from Okla-
home City. Okla. to Virginia, 
visiting their children. Steve and 
Shirley Chadwick and boys of 
Veina and Steve and Lynette and 
Monica O'Donnell of Masassas 
and touring Washington D.C. 
and the State Capitol. 

Clifton Boydston flew from 
Amarillo and met his wife in 
Houston where they attended 
Mike Hulse's graduation on 
Thursday. Then Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifton Boydston and Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Hulse and Bill Hend-
erson of Houston all arrived 
home Friday. 

Several from Allison 
the Memorial Service 

Pork Processing including curing 

Double wrapped ;'fly- per pound 

S4.50 a head for butchering 

We butcher Monday thru Friday 8 to12 A.M. except holidays.  

CALL FOR QUARTER—HALF—WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK AND BEEF FOR SALE 

SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 
• 

S 

'p 

it 

411. .011. 	.....  

Hembree Seed Company 

ERMELO LOVEGRASS, MORPA LOVEGRASS, 

MILO, SUDAN GRASS, HYBRID AND BULK 

GARDEN SEEDS 

601 Railroad 	 McLean, Texas 
Phone: 779-2552 

••• 

S 

S 

S 

S 

I 

North of City Phone: 256-3241 
Closing at Noon on Saturday 

a— 
• • 

; 
-Rs CARROL'S 

BARBECUE 

will be open nightly 

during  the summer. 

Serving: 11 A.M. to 10 P.M. 

Monday thru Saturday 

Phone: 256-3451 
Shamrock, Texas 

• 

attended 
for Lee 

Townsley at Durham Okla. re-
cently 

	NaimeniSsesar 

OUR 20th 
ANNIVERSARY 

SALE 
IT IS NOW 20 YEARS OF PROVIDING 

YOU WITH FINE QUALITY FABRIC, AND 

TO SHOW OUR APPRECIATION FOR YOUR 

YOUR PATRONAGE, IT IS . 

20% to 50% Off 
ON EVERYTHING FROM WALL TO WALL. 

YES, FABRIC NOTIONS, TRIM, & NEEDLE ART 
REDUCED AT LEAST 20 

12 Tables At 1/2 Price 

SANDS FABRICS 
& NEEDLECRAFT 
225 N. CUYLER 	669-7909 

PAMPA, TEXAS 

Personal 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Brown 

of Lubbock. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Brown and Danny and 
Amber Lea of Lefors spent the 
Memorial Holidays with their 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Guy 
Brown. Mr. and Mrs. Roma 
Brown of Clinton Okla. Nancy 
Clymer and Jim Garner also 
visited. 

THE SHIRT SHACK 
ios4) 

OPEN NOW %PP( 

L.:

14 East Texas St. 
Candy  & Sherri Lewallen 
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TIMES 
FASHIONS 

"The Insurance didn't cover?" 

A Homeowner Policy covers 
boats and motors to only $— -
theft coverage on all furs and 
jewelry is limited to $t—. For 
more costly items, a special 
endorsement is advised by the 
Rives Insurance Agency. 

RIVES 
115 W — •xas-826-5224 or 826-5202 

Security Federal's 
Money Market 

Certificates Pay 
THIS 
WEEK 9.409 

This is an annual rate and is subject to change 
at renewal. The Federal Regulations prohibit 
compounding of interest during the term of this 
account. This 6-month investment with a 
$10,000.00 minimum is available at any Sec-
urity Federal office. Federal Regulations re-
quire a substantial penalty for early with-
drawal. 

SECURITY FEDERAL 
SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

Pampa: W. Francis at Gray 
Amarillo: 1501 Polk, 45th & Teckla, 3105 S. Georgia 
Hereford: 1017 W. Park Avenue. 
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Callan 4-20-79 NE% Sec 74 Blk 
13 
AOL--CIG Exploration, Inc to 
Grico 2-13-78 Out of Secs 22, 31, 
32, 33 Blk RE; 7, — B 1 B&B Sur 
AOL--J Roger Allspaugh to HNG 

Court Records 
From Page 4 

to Red Car, Inc 11-30-78 Lots 1 to 
4 Blk 37 Wheeler 
MML--W W Aaron et al to R C 

Allen. 
Mrs. Laura Fern Selby was 

dismissed from the Parkview 
Hospital, Saturday morning fol-
lowing several weeks stay. 

Mr. and Ms. R. St. John 
visited early last week with their 
daughter and family in Abilene. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Coward, 
Mrs. Sandra Randolph, Dean 

I) 

Danny and Dennis spent Sunday 
with the Coward's son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Coward and family, 
near Canadian. 

Glenda Sherrell left Tuesday 
morning for Copan, Okla, after 
visiting her parents Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Sherrell and her sister, 
Penny Sherrell and friends for 
several weeks. 

The Regular monthly blood 
pressure clinic will be held in 
Mobeetie, Friday afternoon at 
2:00 and at 5:00 the members of 
the XYZ Club will convene for a 
short meeting, dismissing to be 

Oil Co 4-18-79 E1/2  NW% Sec 30 
Blk A-3 
AOL--A E Gamble to HNG Oil Co 
4-27-79 107 ac SW% Sec 88 Blk 
13 
AOL--Malouf Abraham Co Inc to 
Moody Energy Co 5-22-79 S1/2  
Sec 63 Blk 24 
AOL--J C Childers to Jess W 
Sheets 5-17-79 NW% SE% Sec 
56 Blk 24 
OL--Mac W Hancock III Diamond 
Shamrock Corp 3-7-79 NW% Sec 
48 BIk A-5 
2 AOL--Bill Spillman to Glenn 
Cope 5-17-79 SE' Sec 74 Blk 23 
D--Lila Eunice Treadwell et al to 
C 0 Killingsworth et ux 4-20-79 
177'x100' SE% Sec 60 Blk A-8 
MD--Gertrude Lasater to A W 
Burrell 5-22-79 40 ac int NW% 
Sec 28 Blk A-8 
DT--A W Burrell et ux to First St 
Bk Mobeetie 5-23-79 Mins 48, 54 
A-7; E1/2  SE1/4  7, N70 ac SW'/. 9, 
A-3; Sec 18 0S2; N% 2 AB&M 
Sur; E 50 ac 1 Cert 5/ 720 
ASSIGN OVERRID ROY--Amar-
illo Oil Co to Pioneer Prod Co 
5-23-79 W1/2  SE'/4 18 Blk L 
MAY 24, 1979 
MD--A W Burrell to Viola Carl-
ton 5-24-79 3 ac int SE% Sec 27 

4 

Engagement 
Mr. and Mrs. James A. Carn- 

agey of Edmond, Ok. are proud 

a 
Burns of Van Horn, Texas. He is 
a graduate of Van Horn high 
school and presently employed 
by Borsherry Construction Co. 

The couple plan a July 31 
wedding. 

Engagement 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Coates 

wish to announce the engage-
ment and approaching marriage 
of their daughter Cindy Diann to 
John Allen Burns. John is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Thomas J. 

.o announce the engagement and 
forth coming marriage of their 
daughter, Pamela Dee Ann to 
Ricky James Hickernell. The 
wedding will be June 30 in 
Amarillo TX, Calverey Christian 
Church 601, S. Cleveland. 
Grandparents of the bride are 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Walker of 
Allison, Tx. 

Blk A-8 
3 UNIT DESIGN—E1 Paso Natural 
Gas Co et al to Eugene R Brewer 
et al 5-15-79 S1/2  & NE% Sec 26 
& NE% 27 Blk RE 
2 OLs--Kenneth Maurice Haynes 
et al to Hunt Energy Corp 3-1-79 
NE% Sec 8 Blk E 
D--Chester ee Glancy Jr et ux to 
m J Petty 5-19-79 E25 ft Lots 1,2 
Blk 10 Shamrock 
ROL--Sun Oil Co to Virginia D 
Grobe 4-30-79 Sec 79 Elk 13 
OL--Birdie Bennett Ailstock to 
Malouf Abraham 8-15-78 NW% 
15 A-4 AOL to Sun Oil Co 
AOL--CIG Ex-Ploration Inc to W 
H Attebury et al 5-3-79 SE' Sec 
7 Camp Co Sch Land 
2 OL--J Lee Youngblood, Trustee 
to Penny L Youngblood 4-20-79 
20 to 23 Camp Co Sch Land 
2 AOL--Penny L Youngblood to 
Page Petroleum, Inc 4-26-79 
DT--Kenneth Wischkaemper et 
ux to United States of Amer 
5-24-79 S1/2  Sec 5 Blk 24 
DT--Clay A Gabel et ux to United 
States of Amer 5-24-79 SW1/4  Sec 
59 Blk 23 exc 3'/2 ac 
MAY 25, 1979 
ROW--Henry Hamilton et al to El 
Paso Natural Gas Co 3-23-79 Pt 
Sec 22 BIk A-4 
5 RENTAL DIV ORDERS--Lillian 
Johnson Bush et al to J T 
Johnson et al 5-3-79 Land not set 
out 
OL--William R Wood et ux to R C 
Callan 4-23-79 Sec 6 Blk OS 2 
OL--Jack Downer et al to R C 
Callan 5-18-79 Sec 6 Blk 0S2 
OL--James A Smith et al to Rex 
Fuller 1-15-76 E'/2 NE% Sec 5 
Blk A-4 
ASSIGN INCOME--William R 
Wood et ux to United States of 
Amer 5-25-79 Land not set out 
2 SUB--E Byron Range Jr et ux to 
United States of Amer 5-22-79 
REV P OF ATTY--Trula Galmor 
to Floyd Ray Morris 5-25-79 
RVL & RDT--Grace A Meek to 
Daonal E Rives 5-23-79 Lots 1 to 
5 Blk C, Wheeler Park Adn 
DISTRICT CLERK'S OFFICE 
#7577 Marie Lister vs John T 
Haskins 5-21-79 suit on debt 
#7579 Bob Stovall vs Mutual Oil 
Co of America. Inc 5-25-79 Suit 
on Debt 

Mobeetie Saw 
& Lock Shop 
SAW (HAPPENING 

Q. LOCKSMITH PIG 
Phone: 845-2353 

R. St. John 
14obeetie 

P&WD Stocks 
Area Ponds 

By Mrs. Wilber Beck 
Mr. and Mrs. Kent Dyson and 

baby daughter, Lee Anne of 
Garland visited his grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Dyson, Monday afternoon on 
their way home. Earlier last 
week they came to Pampa to visit 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. R.M. 
Dyson for the Memorial Day 
weekend. 

Mrs. Peggy Dunn who recently 
moved to Canadian from Wheel-
er, visited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tince Williams last week-
end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Binion, 
Stephney, Doug and Betsy of 
Midland visited the lady's par-
ents and brother Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Gudgel and Ronald Gud-
gel over the weekend. 

Mrs. Ruth Beck of Dumas 
visited her aunt Mrs. Laverne 
Scribner Sunday afternoon. 
Monday afternoon Mrs. Jack 
Sims and son of Canyon also 
visited Mrs. Scribner. 

Recent visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. E.F. Lester were three of 
Mrs. Lester's sisters. They were 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Mayo of 
Paducah, Mrs. Lance Andrews 
and Mrs. Opal Coker of Child-
ress. Also visiting were James 
Lester, their son and a friend, 
Wanda Kelsey of Borger. 

Glynnda Leatherman and Al-
len and Glenda Sherrell visited 
and attended to business in 
Pampa, Thursday last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. R.W. Beck of 
Lefors were guests of their sister 
in law, Mrs. Wilber Beck, Satur-
day afternoon. While here they 
also visited their neice and family 
Mr. and Mrs. Butch Leatherman 
and Allen. 

Mr. Bob Mickey is enjoying a 
week of fishing and relaxing in 
Colorado, this week. 

Mrs. Laverne Scribner and 
Mrs. Elnita Atkins visited and 
attended to business in Pampa, 
Tuesday. 

C.W. Burch attended to busi-
ness and visited his sister and 
brother in law, Mr. and Mrs. 
L.E. Kieth in Pampa, Saturday 
afternoon. 

The Rev. and Mrs. Elton 
Wyatt of Lubbock visited their 
son and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
E.F. Lester as dinner guests 
Sunday. The Sims family also 
were Sunday dinner guests. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Atkins 
and family of Amarillo visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W.M. 
Atkins last weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Bryant, 
Daniel and Carol of Amarillo and 
the lady's father, Jim Sackett 
who resides in the Pampa Nurs-
ing Center, were Sunday Dinner 
guests of Mrs. Wilber Beck. 
Also visiting were C.W. Burch 
and son William and Mr. and 
Mrs. Butch Leatherman and 

t 

I was a stranger . . . 

Ladies Casual 

Clothes 

Pants 
Blouses 
Shells 

Skirts 

SIZES 6-46 

Engagement 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Selby of 

Mobeetie announce the engage-
ment and approaching marriage 
of their daughter, Kathleen to 

Mark Gilmer, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Gilmer of Wheeler. A 
June 9 wedding is planned for 
7:30 p.m. in the First United 
Methodist Church in Mobeetie. 

4 

in the revival services in the First 
Baptist Church at 7:30 p.m. 

Seven Mobeetie Seniors with 
their sponsors left Dallas Tues-
day morning for Hawaii, where 
they will spend a week sight-see-
ing. They plan to return home, 
Tuesday next week. 

Mrs. Laura Fern Selby is still a 
patient in the Parkview Hospital 
in Wheeler, at this time. 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny C. 
Murrell and family of Pampa 
attended Commencement Exer-
cises in Mobeetie Friday even-
ing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Drew Godwin 
and family of Tucumcari, N.M. 
and Mr. and Mrs. Geoffrey 
Caldwell and family of Amarillo 
visited their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A.G. Caldwell, last week-
end. 

Mrs. Jean Banks was dismiss-
ed from the Parkview Hospital 
after several days stay, last 
week. 

Recent guests of the Rev. and 
Mrs. John Hansard were Mrs. 
Pat Comerford of Olton and Mrs. 
Helen Roller, a Nurse Missionary 
who has just returned from a 
Mercy Mission in Guyana, Af-
rica. She has been on a special 
assignment of inoculating 	a- 
gainst a killer virus of measles. 

Recently J. R. Patterson visit-
ed his daughter and family Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawayne Hogan in 
Pampa and attended the Piano 
Recital in which his grandson, 
Brian participated. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenny Sherrell 
and Christy Ann of Copan, OK 
left Thursday last week for home 
after visiting for several days 
with their parents, C.W. Burch 
and William, Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Sherrell and Penny and Melba 
Corcoran. They also visited other 
relatives and friends both in 
Mobeetie and Pampa while here. 

Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Patterson 
attended the Spring Music Festi-
val in Pampa, Friday last week 
where their granddaughter, Jana 
Hogan gave several renditions. 
Sunday evening the Pattersons 
had as guests the Drew Godwins 
of Tucumcari and the Jay God-
wins of Canadian. Mrs. Marcella 
Hogan, Jana and Brian of Pampa 
also visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Patterson, Sunday evening. 

Mobeetie Seniors Return 
The 1979 Mobeetie Seniors 

arrived home about noon, Tues-
day after spending a week in 
Hawaii. 

According to a spokesman they 
stayed at the Coralree Hotel in 
Honululu. 

Along with spending time on 
WyKeeKee Beach, they toured 
several islands (names unpro-
nounceable), saw the Diamond 
Head Mountain, attended a Lulo, 
and thoroughly enjoyed it and 
took a boat cruise to Pearl 
Harbor. 

Going from Amarillo to Dallas 
they took a flight directly to 
Hawaii which took eight hours. 

Seniors making the trip were; 
Denise Hilburn, Gail Hodges, 
Kelly Howard, Randy Stuart, 
Richard Laverty, Danny Farrar 
and Mark Hefley. Their sponsors 
were James and Belenda Mas-
ters. 

WHEN THE TIME IS FOREVER 

Dinner Closes 
78-79 Club Year 

Hap Martin, Mrs. Martin all 
helped me care for the children 
spending hours, feeding, rocking 
and caring for them. Mrs. Ben 
Hefley opened her home to me, 
as did Farmer and Opal Hefley 
preparing lunch for me. Jack and 
Bernice Hefley are old friends 
that provided everything some-
one else had not already provided 

Even a play pen was provided 
for the baby. 

Words cannot express our 
thanks for all that was shown to 
us but we can say that we have 
seen the love Jesus speaks of and 
we have seen it in Wheeler, 
Texas. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Hendrix 
(parents) Box 26, Hardesty, OK 
73944. 

Mr. and Mrs. Boots Avent, 
Will, Wes and Jody Lee, Kerrick, 
Texas 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy DeArmond 
and family, Spearman, Texas 

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Shryock, 
and family, Turpin, OK 

The words of Matthew 25: 
34-36 were made manifest to us 
in Wheeler, Texas May eigh-
teenth. 

My daughter. Rene Avent, her 
son, Will - five, daughter Jody 
Lee - 4 months, and I were 
returning from a trip to Dallas 
when Rene became ill. We knew 
that she was too ill to continue 
home but, we had decided to get 
as close as possible. We had 
stopped at the light in Wheeler 
when she informed me that she 
couldn't make it any further. We 
backtracked to the hospital and 
found a doctor on duty. Rene' 
received immediate attention by 
a very capable and efficient staff 
and doctor. Dr. Galutia, the 
other doctors, all the nurses and 
personnel of Parkview Hospital 
would be the envy of any 
communtiy. I watched with joy 
and a grateful heart at the 
efficiency of the ambulance ser-
vice and all the other facets of 
serving the needs of people. 

Rene' her children and I were 
the recipients of love showered 
on us by everyone whose lives 
crossed ours those three days. 

The family of Mr. Martin, who 
was hospitalized at the time, 
ministered to our needs so beau-
tifully. Ida Goad, Mr. and Mrs. 

Richard's 
	1, 

RADIATOR & HEAD 
SHOP 

Complete Radiator 
and 

Cylinder Head Work 
301 E. 12th 
Ph. 256-3151 

Shamrock, Texas 
Richard Blakemore 

Owner 

A look at the accomplishments 
of the past year and the expec-
tations for a new year were 
examined in the last meeting 
held May 24 by the Thursday 
Review Club in Wheeler. 

Through the review and for-
ward look, club members are 
seeking ways to improve and pull 
efforts together into productive 
action 

A covered dish dinner accom-
panied this evaluation and pro-
jection forum. 

Eight dub members were 
guests in the home of Karen 
Puryear with Noveline Loyd ser-
ving as co-hostess. Those at-
tending the dinner and meeting 
were Lynda Allen, Donna Walser 
Linda Daughtry, Jeanne Roper, 
Rita Smith, Marianna McGaugh-
ey, Fredricka Admas and Jo 
Bedowitz. 

CANYON -- Many lakes in 
northwest Texas are now re-
ceiving stockings of non-native 
game fish such as walleye, 
striper and striper hybrids, and, 
smallmouth bass which will fill 
the acres of water not used or 
inhabited by our native species of 
fish. 

"The goal of 40-50 million 
walleye eggs is high, but a good 
season at lake Meredith and 
additional eggs from other states 
should fill our stocking needs," 
said Joe Kraai, P&WD fishery 
biologist. 

Many lakes will or already 
have been stocked with walleye 
including: Fort Phantom Hill and 
Clyde lakes near Abilene; Moss 
Creek City lake near Big Spring; 
and, White River and Buffalo 
Springs lakes on the South Plains 
according to Kraai. 

One of the biggest news items 
among fishermen in Texas is the 
Florida Strain of the largemouth 
bass stocked in several lakes in 
out state. Most of the large 
Florida largemouth have come 
from central or east Texas, but r 
the P&WD has already stocked 
these fighters in Lake Theo at 
Caprock Canyons State Park near 
Quitaque and more will be stock-
ed in Greenbelt lake near Clar-
endon. 

Smallmouth bass fishing is 
growing with a new state record 
now on the book. Both Lake Theo 
and White River lake will receive 
stockings of these scrappy fight-
ers this spring. 

The stripers and striper hy-
brids continue to make news at 
many West Texas lakes. Lake 
Diversion near Wichita Falls will 
receive these fast-growing hy-
brids this spring. 

These releases are only a part 
of the continuing P&WD fish 
stocking program with a goal of 
furnishing Texas anglers a va-
riety of fighting, good-eating fish 
to catch. Additional stockings of 
native fish such as largemouth 
bass and catfish are scheduled 
this spring and summer, also. 

'The girl who blushes needs 
no make-up." Russian Proverb 

SHOWN TRIO SETS FOR $2575° 

We have wedding sets to capture the expression of 
your love. Sets garnished with all diamonds or with 
mixtures of rubies, emeralds, and blue sapphires. 

Personal 
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Childress 

were pleasantly surprised Wed-
nesday May 23, when those of 
their children who live near 
arrived bringing supper with all 
the trimmings. 	Children and 
grandchildren were Helen and 
Richard Dyson and Kim of Sayre 
OK. Fat and Wanda Childress 
Cathy, Shawn and Shelly, Pat 
and Wayne Childress Briscoe. 
Wynola Lindon and Sandra San-
ders Pampa. Texas, Kenneth 
Brenda, Draton, Tami and Bran-
don of Wheeler and visitors Mr. 
Murry Sanders and Ronnie Hin-
son a lovely time was enjoyed by 
all. 	The occasion was Mrs. 
Childress' birthday who was very 
surprised as they did not tell she 
and her husband they were 
coming 

"All progress progress is based upon 
a universal desire on the 
part of every organism to 
live beyond its income." 

Samuel Bohn 

/ 
	'VITALLY 

"AN INDIVIDUAL) TUUCH 

.._, 121 N. Cuyler 	 Downtown Pampa 
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Article from BORGER NEWS HEARLD: Summer Rec. Program WTSU AWARDS 325 SCHOLARSHIPS 
include out-of-state students. 

"People are now realizing how 
important this program is not 
only to the students, but to the 
University as well," Winter no- 

ted. 
President's Honor Scholar 

from Wheeler is Beth Wills, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Wills. 

# Jane Butler Visits Here 

From Near Arctic Circle 
CITY COUNCIL MEETS 

The Summer Recreation Pro-
gram, sponsored by the Wheeler 
Public Schools, will begin Tues-
day, June 12. Anyone who is 
enrolled in the Wheeler School 
System, or will be enrolled next 
year is eligible to participate in 
this program. 

The program will run on 
Tuesday, Wednesday, and 
Thursday each week. 

Time Schedule 
Kindergarten-first-second -

9: 00 - 10:00. 
Third-Fourth-Fifth - 10:00 

11:00 
Sixth and Up - 11:00 - 12:00 

The time to come ww De 
determined by the grade the 
student will be in the coming 
school year. It is important that 
your child come only for the time 
designated, due to the variety of 
activities planned. Some of the 
activities planned are Tennis, 
Tumbling, Softball, Track and 
Soccer. 

No advanced registration is 
necessary. Classes will meet in 
the Legion Building just North of 
the football field. If you have any 
questions concerning the Sum-
mer Recreation Program contact 
Coach Carter at 826-3024 

GSPA Calls For USDA Investigation 
est. The 59 cent deficiency 
payment for the 1978 crop cer-
tainly does not bridge that gap. 
The loss will probably be larger 
in 1979, due to the increased cost 
of production and the prospects 
for another bumper crop. We 
cd your help." 

Clarendon College 
Offers Courses 

equipment. Louis Stas seconded, 
motion carried. 

Louis Stas motion the meeting 
adjourn, Bob Roark seconded, 
motion carried. 

Special Meeting 
May 21, 1979 

Mayor Burton opened the spe-
cial meeting of May 21, 1979 by 
introducing Attorney John David 
who in turn reported they had 21 
units to release for paving: 
namely Nos. 4,7,8,13,15,16,17, 
18,19,21,22,23,24,25,26,27,28, 
35,37. There was discussion of 
what blocks these units included. 
Also Attorney David explained 

there were two property owners: 
Wiley estate and Lillian Lee, who 
had not signed a lien. These 
owners will be assessed in order 
for Units #26 and 27 to be 
released. Attorney David also 
pointed out Mrs. Cora Teakell's 
property abutting Osage street 
was not on the assessment roll so 
the Council should be consider-
ing that unit. 

Louis Stas motion there be an 
assessment prepared against Lil-
lian Lee and Wiley Estate prop-
erty in Units 26 and 27, Berniece 
Hall seconded, motion carried. 

Louis Stas motion the meeting 
adjourn, David Cross seconded, 
motion carried. 

JANE BUTLER is home from Fort Yukon, Alaska, 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Harold Robertson, 
1417 Cooley. With her are her son, Jason, 3, and her 
daughter, Kellee, five months. Jane's husband, Doug, 
owns and operates an air charter service in the village 
eight miles north of the Arctic Circle. 

Clarendon College has an-
nounced that registration for 
Summer classes to be held in 
Wellington is scheduled for 
Monday, June 4th from 6:00 to 
7:00 p.m. at Wellington High 
School. Registration for classes 
in Childress will be on Tuesday, 
June 5th from 6:00 to 7:00 p.m. 
at Childress High School. Books 
will be sold during registration. 

Classes will begin on Monday, 
June 4th and will run from 6-10 
p.m. each night. 	The first 
session will end on July 12th. 
The second session is scheduled 
from July 16-August 24. 

Courses offered the first Sum-
mer session: 
Monday-Wednesday 
Eng. 113-17 - Composition and 
Reading - Pelfrey - Wellington 
Psy. 133-17 - Intro, to Psychology 
- Cordwill • Wellington 
Tuesday-Thursday 
Eng. 263-1C - World Literature -
Pelfrey - Childress 
Psy. 133-1C - Intro. to Psychol-
ogy - Vinson - Childress 
*BA 214-1C - Accounting Princi-
ples - McKelvey - Childress 
Math 113-1C - College Algebra -
Walker j- Childress 
* Lab required. 

The Grain Sorghum Producers 
Association has called for a 
Congressional investigation of 
USDA's failure to administer the 
1979 Feed Grain Program, ac- 
cording to the law passed by 
Congress in 1977. The House of 
Representatives Committee on 
Agriculture Chairman Thomas S. 
Foley, was officially requested to 
conduct a formal hearing into the 
problem, in a letter (dated May 
21) from GSPA Executive Direc-
tor Elbert Harp. 

The Purpose will be to insure 
that USDA administers the Feed 
Grain Program as Congress in-
tended. The Agriculture Act of 
1977 established a formula for 
determining grain sorghum tar- 
get prices. 	Grain Sorghum 
Producers Association is asking 
that this formula be applied. 

Dr. Howard Hjort, Director of 
Economics for USDA, recently 
admitted to the Subcommittee on 
Livestock and Grains, "There is 
in fact a discrepancy. The $2.30 
will have to be increased very 
likely to $2.35, in order to be 
consistent with the law." GSPA 
contends that the increase should 
be 10 to 18 cents (depending 
upon which USDA cost of pro-
duction figures are used.) 

Harp told the Chairman, "The 
grain sorghum farmers of the 
United States are in critical 
economic condition at this time. 
They need all possible help to 
survivie the present low prices. 
The tenant farmers in the United 
States was $3.62 per hundred 
weight, and this is after paying 
storage and interest on grain 
from harvest time until the 
middle of May. This is an 
average net loss of $1.40 per 
hundred, plus storage and inter- 

By AD MIHM 
Women's Editor 

life at Fort Yukon, Alaska, 
eight miles north of the Arctic 
Circle, is pleasant, slow-paced, 
ancl. challenging, according to 
Jane Butler, who is visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Robertson, 1417 Cooley. 

Jane came here with her son, 
Jason, 3, and her daughter, 
Kellee, five months, for her 
annual visit with her parents. 
She will be joined here soon by 

4 her husband, Doug, and then 
the family will travel to Miami, 
Fla. to visit Jane's brother, 
Larry Robertson, and to return 
to Fort Yukon in mid-June. 

Jane Robertson Butler has 
lived in Fort Yukon for the past 
seven years. She grew up in 
Borger, graduating from 
Borger High School in 1967. She 
attended Frank Phillips College 
and West Texas State 
University. 

In 1972. Jane went to Fort 
Yukon, to visit her brother, who 
was employed with an air 
service there. She met Doug 
Butler of Kapowsin, Wash., 
owner of an air charter service, 
and became his wife. 

She did not have great dif-
ficulty adjusting to a new way 
of life, for as most persons from 
"the lower 48" she was ap-
preciative of the slower tempo. 
fascinated by the long periods 
of daylight during the summer, 
and willing to accent the 
positive in a new environment. 

"What is difficult fo me," she 
said, "is adjusting to life when I 
come back te Texas. There are 

A 	so many people, there is so 
much traffic that it's scary." 

Jane pointed out that her 
small son is also bewildered by 
local life. When his grandfather 
was watering the lawn, little 
Jason, accustomed to being 
frugal with the use of water. 
asked, "Why is Grandpa 
washing his grass?".  

"Water must be hauled te 
homes in Fort Yukon." .lane 
explained. 

"We now have running water 
in our house. It comes 
from a holding tank, which 
must be filled periodically. 
Most homes have 55 gallon 
drums of water in the kitchen 
There are few bathrooms, but 
we • do have electricity and 
telephones." 

The Butlers live in a frame 
house in the village of 750 
persons including 150 white. 
four Eskimos. and the rest 
Athabascan Indians. 

"Most of the houses are log 
cabins," Jane said. "we lived in 
one until two years ago, when 
we got a frame house." 

Jane had to be flown to 
Fairbanks to have her children. 

• Her mother came to be with her 
last December when Kellee 
arrived. 

"Doug keeps busy," Jane 

Gasohol Bill 
Passes Senate 

Pepper accounts for over 
one-fourth of the world's 
total trade in spices. 

said, explaining that her 
husband delivers groceries, 
fuel and other freight to nine 
villages around Fort Yukon, 
and that he hauls freight for 

\government agencies in the 
town. 

"In the fall. he flies hunters 
out to the wilderness to hunt 
caribou, moose, and sheep," 
she said. "In the winter, he 
takes groceries and mail to 
trappers and brings in their 
furs." 

Jane said that no roads lead 
to Fort Yukon, as the only 
way to get there is by air. She 
said that there are cars and 
motor bikes in town, and that 
they are used on dirt roads. 

"In a small town," she said. 
"we get to know everybody, and 
do a lot of visiting. We get 
together to play cards, or have 
dinners in each other's hothes.' 
Most of the pople arc from other 
slates and have been in Alaska 
for many years. The teachers 
are usually newcomers, 
though." 

Jane reported that the 
climate is very dry. so that the 
cold is bearable. 

'The average winter tem-
perature Is :13 degrees below 
zero,-  she said. "but it is often 
65 degrees below. in summer, 
the average temperature is 75 
degrees, but I've seen it get as 
high as 104." 

She told about the 24 hours of 
daylight in the summer, when it 
is difficult to adjust to 
brightness, and when the sun 
doesn't set at all on June 21. 
Then she contrasted the winter 
months, when the sun doesn't 

'rise on Dec. 21, and when her 
husband has only four hours of 
flying time, from 10 a.m. to 2 
p.m. She admitted getting most 
tired of winter darkness, and 
not minding the two to three 
feet of snow that covers the 
ground all winter. 

"The biggest difficulty," she 
said, "is the high prices. We 
pay $150 a month for electricity 
in the winter, and we do not use 
it for heat, as we have oil heat. 
We pay $1.99 a dozen for eggs, 
SI.09 for a loaf of bread, $1.29 a 
pound for apples; and $4.29 for 
a half gallon of mick.:.:1  
Sr • 

Doug 
41- 	• 

an* Jane plat to sell 
their service and work on a 
management contract for the 
next two years. 

"Then," Jane said, "we will 
leave Fort Yukon. We want to 
get back to "the lower 48", 
closer to Doug's parents in 
Portland, Ore., and to mine in 
Borger. Texas. 

Wherever the Butlers go, 
they'll be able to adjust to their 
environment, flying away now 
and then to renew themselves in 
other parts of the world. 

Regular Meeting 
May 21, 1979 Council meeting 

opened with Louis Stas motion-
ing to accept the minutes as 
presented. Bob Roark seconded, 
motion carried. 

Kirven Roper motion to pay 
bills as written, David Cross 
seconded, motion carried. 

Arden Kenady met with coun-
cil to discuss cost of producing 
raw water. Mr. Kenady asked 
the council for a 2 cent per 
thousand gallon raise. 	Mr. 
Kenady was told his request 
would be considered. 

Rick DeArment and Ken 
Daughtry of the Fire Department 
met with council to report on 
activities of that department. 
Also to request help in buying a 
used vehicle to transport rescue 
equipment. It was agreed a 
check should be made to deter-
mine the ownership of the ve-
hicle. 

Richard Wallace reported on 
reciepts and disbursements for 
the month of April. 

Discussion of Mr. Kenady's 
request was held. Berniece Hall 
motion to abide by contract as 
written, David Cross second, 
motion carried. 

Donald Ford reported on ac-
tivities of the City employees, 
Kirven Roper motion Mr. Ford 
order a fork life kit for the back 
hoe, David Cross seconded, mo-
tion carried. 

Berniece Hall motion Donald 
Ford be given permission to 
attend wastewater short school in 
Lubbock May 29-31, 1979. Louis 
Stas second, motion carried. 

Joe Weatherly visited with 
Council about building and air 
port for the City of Wheeler. 
Also Mr. Weatherly 	rec- 
ommended the City pass an 
ordinance pertaining to spray 
planes using spray around and 
above the City. 

Thurman Rives met with 
Council to discuss insurance 
coverage for City property Louis 
Stas motion to raise the coverage 
on the office and fire department 
building, contents of city office, 
ware house and contents. Kirven 
Roper seconded, motion carried. 

Berniece Hall reported she 
recommended Gwen Cornett be 
hired as Swimming pool man-
ager, Bob Roark motion hire 
Mrs. Cornett as pool manager at 
$480.00 per month. 	Kirven 
Roper second, motion carried. 
Mrs. Cornett is to secure 2 life 
guards at $2.90 per how 

Louis Stas motion D. Larry 
Barbour be appointed City 
Health Officer for year June 1, 
1979 to May 31, 1980, Kirven 
Roper seconded, motion carried. 

Kirven Roper motion not to 
contribute any funds to thc Fire 
Department toward buyhg a 
vehicle to transport rescue 

Wheeler Elementary 
Sixth Six Weeks Honor Roll 

1st Grade - All A's - Shane 
Boring, Dee Dee Dorman, Kim-
berly Jones, Mitchie Loyd, Lind-
sey McCasland, and Rhonda 
Miller. 
A's and B's - Gina Bond, Austin 
Bradstreet, Heather Eliasen, 
Billy Fancher, Shelly Graves, 
Monty Kinnard and Kelli Sutton 
2nd Grade - All A's - Elissa 
McGaughey, Tammy Gallagher, 
Tera Henderson, and Cory Cor-
nett. 
A's and B's - Billy Johnston, 
Kristi Finsterwald, Lisa Jones, 
Marcy Rogers, Stephanie Beard, 
Teri Ford, Chad Bentley, and 
Dwight Thomas. 
B's - Brenda Unstead, and 
Tommy Velasquez 
3rd Grade - All A's - Shannon 
Beard, Bawn Boedecker, Dixie 
Harris, Janie Hogan, Dee Ann 
Jolly, Shonda Miller, Chris Bed-
owitz, and Brian Shelton. 
A's and B's - Mindy Hardcastle, 
Regina King, Tom Cook, Tony 
Jackson,' Lee McCasland, Roy 
Petit. 
B's - Mandy Rogers 
4th Grade - All A's 	Augie 
Hennard, and Bridgett Wallace. 
A's and B's - Tina Alvey, Tammy 
Baker, Cristen Cornett, Tammie 
Childress, Drew Thomas, and 
Lorri Williams 
5th Grade - A's and B's - Lori 
Lee, Lisa Rivera, Dee Ann Smith, 
and Patricia Zepeda 
B's - Edwin Ellison 

Mrs. Jane Butler is the grand daughter of Mr. & Mrs. Aaron Williams of Wheeler, Texas. 

WTSU--West Texas State Uni-
versity's President's Honor 
Scholarships have been awarded 
to 325 graduating high school 
seniors from 113 Texas, New 
Mexico and Oklahoma towns and 
cities as of May 17, 1979. 

Now in its second year, the 
scholarship program has already 
attracted over one third more 
participants than last year's total 
count, and the number grows 
each week. 

The final number of high 
school honor society members 
who accepted the $100 scholar-
ships to attend West Texas State 
for the 1978-79 academic year 
was 213. 

Not only has the WTSU Pres-
ident's Honor Scholars program 
gained in popularity among the 
tri-state area's scholastically tal-
ented high school seniors, stu-
dents and faculty members on 
the WTSU campus have begun 
donating money to augment the 
scholarship fund. 

Phi Delta Theta social fra-
ternity was the first student 
organization to offer support. 

Of the fraternity's $100 gift, 
Phi Delta Theta president Brady 
Yeary said "We have several 
brothers who have participated in 
this program. We felt that it was 
a worthwhile project, and would 
like to urge other campus organ-
izations to also support it." 

WTSU faculty members, such 
as Dr. Robert Sawvell, acting 
head of the WTSU Geosciences 
Department, are also working to 
broaden on campus the pro-
gram's base of support. 

At first critical of the program, 
Sawvell said that he now feels 
that "For the money spent it is 
the most successful program in 
recruiting high school students to 
WT." 

He has presented the informa-
tion about the program to the 
University's Faculty Council, 
which consists of elected rep-
resentatives from WTSU's entire 
faculty, as well as the individual 
faculty members. 

"I felt that it was time that the 
faculty got involved in a program 
which statistics show to be 
successful not only in recruiting 
students but retaining them," he 
said. 

The President's Honor Schol-
ars themselves are doubled de-
lighted, according to program 
sponsor Keith Winter, WTSU 
director of Development. 

"They are excited not only 
about the recognition of their 
academic abilities, but also about 
the special attention they receive 
once they get here," Winter 
said. 

In the program's first year, the 
students were invited to recep-
tions with President Max Sher-
man, their families and WTSU 
faculty members, as well as 
treated to dinner and a drama 
production, he said. 

Winter said that one of his 
goals for the program is to be 
able to give $100 each year for 
the student's four years in 
school. 

Already he has expanded it to 

glocoe   

AUSTIN--The Texas Senate 
passed legislation by a vote of 
28-0 legislation legalizing the 
production of alcohol in Texas for 
fuels. House Bill 1986 authored 
by State Representative Bill 
Keese (D-Somerville) and spon-
sored in the Texas Senate by 
Valley State Senator Raul Long-
oria (D-Edinburg) is legislation 
vital to the development of 
alcohol fuel facilities, such as 
gasohol, in Texas. 

The legislation creates a new 
permit in the Alcoholic Beverage 
Code allowing for the production 
of gasohol. Currently, the alco-
hol portion of gasohol has been 
prohibited in the State for more 
than forty years. 	Under a 
changing energy situation, the 
law presents a barrier to the 
development of gasohol in Texas. 
Already shortages are being 
experienced in some parts of the 
nation. Texas is currently exper-
iencing some diesel fuel short-
ages. 

,) 
inson's, The Bill Walkers of 
Wildorado, and the Charles Da-
vis family spent the week end at 
Green Belt Lake. 

visit Mae Muse now. 
Glen and Edna moved down 2 

weeks ago. 
Berniece Zollar daughter Carla 

waS delivering grocerie was in a 
car wreck broke her pelvis and 
some teeth we sure wish for her 
to soon be doing ok again. 

We received more rain this 
week today is the 24. This is for 
the ones away. We are wet. 

Maybe Markham visited the 
Colie Parkers Tuesday. 	She 

brought us some greens. 
Carol Dean Hall visited us 

Wednesday she has been helping 
Mary Lou pack and get ready to 
move. 

Bob and Mary lou sold their 2 
store house to Lester. Clydene 
Hall, they are moving in to 
Allison, this use to be Charlie 
Parker house for our people in 
Valley Claud and Mable Parker 
visited the Colie Parkers Monday 
night. 

Debby Clark visited the J.O. 
Helton and Kathy Monday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alton Wilkinson 
of Nunn Colo, visited the Cliff 
Walkers last week and attended 
the funeral of Alton's Nephew 
Oscar Weldon Armstrong at Kel-
ton. They spent several days 
with Mrs. Opal Armstrong. 

The Cliff Walkers, Alton Wilk- 

Hospital Notes New Arrival FIRST FEDERAL 

• 

Sateinv & ("tan ..-4nociation 

P. O. BOX 109 — CHILDRESS. TEXAS 79201 (817) 937-2514 
BRANCH OFFICES 

MEMPHIS 	WELLINGTON 

INTEREST RATES ON SAVINGS NOW BEING PAID BY FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS 
AND LOAN ASSOCIATION OF CHILDRESS: 

REGULAR PASSBOOK 	INTEREST PAID FROM DAY OF DEPOSIT TO DAY OF 
WITHDRAWAL 	ADD TO OR WITHDRAW FROM ACCOUNT IN ANY AMOUNT 
AT ANY TIME.  

5.39% EFFECTIVE ANNUAL YIELD WHEN INTEREST IS LEFT TO ACCUMAT TE.  

CERTIFICATE ACCOUNTS 
ANNUAL YIELD WITH DAILY 	 • 
CONTOURING IF INTEREST 

RATE 	 IS LEFT TO ACCUMULATE 

5.25% 

MINIMUM 
TERM 

MINIMUM 
AMOUNT 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Brickey 
are the proud parents of a new 
baby boy born May 20 at 10:52 
a.m. Carl Wade weighed 8Ib 4oz 
and is 21 inches long. Was born 
in Shamrock General Hospital. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Edwards of 
Kelton Texas and Tommy Cal-
verly Sr. Frisco Texas. Paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Brickey of Wheeler Texas. 
Great Grandmothers are Dufi 
Yarbought of Como Texas and 
Alice Calverley of Frisco Texas. 

Here & There 

1 YEAR 	$1,000 
2 1/2  YEARS 	$1,000 
4 YEARS 	$1,000 
6 YEARS 	S1,000 
8 YEARS 	$1,000 

6.72 0/0 
6.98% 
7.79% 
8.06% 
8.33% 

6.50% 
6.75% 
7.50% 
7,75% 
8.00% 

[MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATES (NO COMPOUNDING) 6 MONTHS $10,0001 
MRTIFICATE ACCOUNTS MATURE AT THE END OF THE CALANOAR QUARTER FOLLOWING THE STA 
rum (EXCEPT MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATES) 

INTEREST ON CERTIFICATE ACCOUNTS IS COMPOUNDED DAILY AND PAID QUARTERLY - 

FEDERAL REGULATORS REQUIRE A SUBSTANTIAL INTEREST PENALTY FOR EARLY WITHDRAWAL OF TIM 
CERTIFICATES.  

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS ACCOUNTS ARE INSURED BY THE FEDERAL SAVING 
AND LOAN INSURANCE CORPORATION, AN AGENCY OF THE UNITED STATES 
GOVERNMENT UP TO $40,000.00 
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turn home. 
Our City streets are so dirty! 

(We have a hoard of litterbugs) I 
hope before our guests to the 
school reunion arrive that the 
mess can be cleaned up - even if 
individual business men have to 
do their own clean up job. 

Next Monday June 4, Senior 
Citizens at 6:30. Social Security 
Representative at 1:00. Blood 
Pressure Clinic Thursday June 7, 
9:00 to 12:00 

II 111 0144 

Old Admissions 
4-21 Ed Jones 
5-5 Eula Markham 
5-13 P.A. Martin 
5-15 Dan Hefley 
New Admissions 
5-24 Kim Goad 

Baby Girl Goad 
Fred Waters 

5-26 Loyd Nelson 
5-27 Eddie Hughes 
5-28 Hoy Hunter 

Dorothy Jamison 
Becky Zybach 
Mike Case 

5-29 Leonard Rathjen 
5-30 W.C. Burrell 
Dismissals 
5-23 Marilyn Nelson 

Randy Bentley 
5-24 Letha Ryan 
5-25 Vickie Gibson 

Sheila Stevens 
Andrew Markham 
Kenneth Franklin 

5-26 Francis Glover 
Laura Selby 

5-28 Fred Waters 
5-29 Kim Goad 

Baby Girl Goad 
Phyllis Barber SERVING THIS AREA SINCE 1,34 

Ark. spent Friday night with Dori 
and Sammie Atherton, and will 
spend Monday nite there. 

D.A. and Linda Davis and 
Children Wendie Shawn and 
Code spent Saturday nite with 
Dori and Sammie and Monday 
nite. 

Dori and Sammie went to 
Pampa took Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Daugherty, Jim and Judy 
Dougherty and children out to 
eat, then they went to McClarn 
Cemetary. 

Dori and Sammie met the 
Davis family at Wheeler Ceme-
tary Monday they all ate at 
Harvey's Cafe then visited the 
Colie Parkers with Andy and 
Troie Davis and D.A and Linda 
children they also visited the J.O. 
Heltons Monday afternoon. 

Curtis and Jane Ann Hall and 
Kent had a party Saturday night 
at her home to celebrate Kent 
and their son in Law's Kyndal 
Murray birthdays those there 
were Elbert and Ruby Zybach 
Bob and Gena Zybach, Bevard 
and Mary Dukes Deidre and 
Andria, David and Beckie Zybach 
Christy and Shawn, Kyndal and 
Kathy Murray of course Curtis 
and Jane Ann and Kent 

Modnay visitors at the Curtis 
Halls were Essie Finsterwald and 
Mona Reynolds. 

Debby Clark is spending this 
week with us. 

Ted and Linda Parker went to 
Dallas Saturday to a bowling 
tournament Linda flew to Albe-
qurque N.M. to a tornament this 
flew to Dallas Ted and some 
more bowling friend from Dumas 
met her in Dallas for this 
tournament rather. 

Etha Rustin of Pampa spent 
one night with Mattie and Bill 
Jackson one night with Effie 
Ronfru, one night with the E.O. 
Kelleys she has gone down to 

T.V. says Diabetes is the 3rd 
killer, is increasing 6 percent 
each year 7 sympton to watch for 
and to know probably diabetes, 
Excess thirst, frequent urinating, 
vision bothering you, loss of 
weight slow healing. 

Claud and Mable visited Lester 
and Mary Hudson Monday after-
noon, 

T.V. Says hair spray will clean 
lip stick and ball points marks on 
clothes. 

White wine will remove red 
wine stains on table clothes. 

Gena Zybach visited her folks. 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Reid and 
visited in hospital with the sick, 
P.A. Martin. 

There was a wedding shower 
Thur. afternoon at Briscoe cafe-
teria for Mr. and Mrs. Ric Helton 
they received a real nice shower. 
The hostesses were Jean Mead-
ows, Doris Finsterwald Verna 
Fillingim Gena Zybach, Kathy 
Zybach, Katie Finsterwald, 
Frances Hefley, Debbie Perry, 
Evolyn Meek, Mary Dodd, 
Chrene Zybach, Dorothy Walker, 
Leslie Austin. 

Saturday night at Briscoe cafe-
teria a wedding for Mike Mead- 
ows and Rolanda Hill. 	The 
hostess on the shower were Geva 
Zybach, Georgia Tipps, Bobbie 
Horn, Edwina Johnson, Deruda 
Begart, Shellie Lindal, Debbie 
Perry, Martha Meek, Jan 
Chandler, Dorothy Walker, Billie 
Stuckey, Lou Dean Dauthet, 
Maudeem Ruthford, Tola Fay 
Meek, Tammie Maddox. 

There was a Davis Reunion in 
Borger Park Sunday there were 
39 Davis Children, Grandchild-
ren and great grandchildren 
these were the relatives of Bert 
and Stella Davis, there were 
other friends and relatives drop-
ped by. 

Andy and Troie Davis from 

Nephew our sympathy goes out o 
all the relatives. 

Alton and Ellie are here for the 
funeral, they were visiting Cliff 
and Dorothy Walker Thursday. 

Word is Jimmy Keelin was 
doing fairly well. 

Colie and Vetola Parker visited 
the Cloud Parkers Monday night 
others there were Jimmy Joe, 
Sandy and children. 

Jimmy and family have moved 
into their new house. 

There was a little get to gather 
Saturday at the Colie Parkers, 
those there were - Andy and 
Troice Davis, D.A. and Linda 
Davis, Wendy Shawn and Corie, 
from Beutonnelle Ark, Darwille 
and Sonnie Atherton, J.O. and 
Hoyle Helton and Kathy, Juan-
eve Gwin and Dale Manning, 
Harmon and Daphne Barry, 
Debby and Kim Gregory and 
Keenis Atherton, Debby Clark, 
Zetha Dougherty, Wanda, Kim 
and Kathy Parker, Leroy and 
Janice Parker, Angie, Jeff, Lee, 
Sue Ann and Katie, Garry and 
Nona Parker, Bobby Randy, Sha-
ni Billy and Sheridon of course 
Colie and Vetola Parker, 

Nelson Parker visited his folks. 
Jeff Parkers debating team in 

Wheeler won 1st in district and 
4th in regional. 

T.V. says 31,000 race horses 
will be born in 1979. 
450 Prisons in United States. 

Nova and Sheridon Parker visited 
Wanda, Kim and Kathy Parker 
Monday. 

Debby Clark fell of our poarch 
tore the leagments and seemed 
to just ruined her knee Saturday 
night. 

Well guess the first thing I 
need to do is make some correc-
tions. 

Earl Hammon is in Mangum 
not home he is Mrs. Willie 
(Wanda) Parker's Daddy. 

Elbert and Ruby Zybach visit-
ed her brother Evert and Iris 
Goad in Pampa. 

Ruby visited the sick folk in 
Wheeler Hopital Beckie Essie, 
P.A 

The weight or sinker lead hit 
Jimmy Keelin in eye. 

Adell McNeal is doing fair last 
word I had. 

Mattie Jackson said Mr. Elgie 
Welch is back at home out in his 
yard today. 

Odes and Loes Hudson visited 
his folks Sunday afternoon. 

Hudsons is Briscoe received 1 
3/10 in. of rain last week. 

Mattie Jackson tells me, that 
her sister Edna and Glen Lester 
has moved down to stay. Now 
Glen is preaching at the Briscoe 
assembly of God Church. They 
bought the old home place and 
fixed it up. 

Bob and Marylou have bought 
the Reynolds house out South 
West of Allison where Lester and 
Clyde live at present time. They 
are moving this house to Allison, 
both houses will be in North part 
of Allison N.W. of the Butane 
office. 

We will miss them. 
I received word Wednesday 

morning that there will be a get 
to gether here at our place 
around 3 o'clock Saturday 26. 

Dorothy Walker was telling me 
the Armstrong at Kelton that did 
was Alton and Ellie Wilkerson 



C & H 

    

SUGAR 
$119 5 lb. 

 

    

 

Bog 

  

    

BORDEN 

EAGLE BRAND 
CONDENSED 

ALPO CHUNKY BEEF 
DOG FOOD 

303 

FRUIT COCKTAIL 

0 Cans 

Serving Wheeler 
County with 
QUALITY FOODS 
at MONEY 
SAVING 
PRICES 

USDA CHOICE 

T-BONE 
STEAKS 

89 

MEDIUM YELLOW 

ONIONS  
TEXAS YELLOW 

SQUASH  
TEXAS 

CABBAGE  
ORANGES

suxT 

3 .$100  

LB 

GUARANTEED d. 
GOOD 
EATING! 

LB. 

14' 2  oz. $ 
Cans 

MILK 
KRAFT 

VELVEETA 
2 lb. 
Box 

Can 

BIRDSEYE 

LITTLE EARS  8 in 

CORNPkg.  

MILNOT 

HOME FREEZER 
MIX 

10 oz. 
Only 

RED & WHITE 

FABRIC 
SOFTNENER 

Gallon 

IBC 
ROOT BEER 
149 

SEVEN SEAS 

CREAMY BACON 

SALAD DRESSING 

8 oz. 
Bottle 

DEL MONTE 

FIELD TRIAL 

CHUNKS 
DOG 

FOOD 
5 lb. Bog 

49 

BORDEN'S 

HI-PRO or 
BUTTERMILK 

6 Pack 
12 oz. 
Cons 

BROOK'S 
TANGY 

CATSUP 
32 oz. Pottle 

69c 
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