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Services pending for Claude 
Crouch at Wright Funeral 
Home. He died Wednesday, 
Dec. 10 In Parkview Hospital. 

Claude Crouch 
Rites Pending 

your donation by December 
24th. 

Send donations to: First 
National Bank in Wheeler, Box 
1040, Wheeler, Texas 79096. 

The Betty Davis fund is 
being held open until the day 
before Christmas so anyone 
wanting to make a contribut-
ionr, or memorial, will have 
the opportunity. Please made 

Betty Davis Fund 
Remains Open 
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'SECOND CASH  DRAWING S SATURDAY 
WINNERS ARE NAMED 
IN FIRST DRAWING SAT. 

The second $300 of the 

JAWS OF LIFE $1300 Christmas Drawing will ORDERED; be given away Saturday. De- 
cember 13, 1980. Third and 
fourth drawings will be Satur- I u N D DRIVE  CONTINUES day, December 20, and Wed- 
nesday, December 24. 

Sixteen people will 	be 

Daryl Snelgrooes, Fire Chief 
of the Wheeler Volunteer Fire 
Department announced this 
week that the department has 
ordered the Jaws-of-life for 
which the Fire Department 
and the North Wheeler County 

4 Ambulance Service has been 
working to acquire. The Jaws-
of-life are needed for use in 
the rescue of accident victims. 
The"jaws" can cut away or 
force apart any obstruction 
which prevents the removal of 
an accident victim without 
danger to the victim. 

The Jaws-of-Life will cost 
$7978.91; to date, $2565.00 
has been contributed toward 
the project. Citizens are re- 

handed script Saturday. The 
$300 script will be divided into 
2-$50; 4-$25 and 10-$10. 

$300 will again be given 
away Saturday, December 20 
divided the same as in the two 
previous drawings. 

Some lucky person will re-
ceive $100 in script December 
24 just in time for Christmas. 
The $100 will be added to $300 
which will again be divided 
into $10s, $25s and $50s. 

Wheeler Merchants and 

minded that all donations are 
tax deductible. 

Donation have been receiv-
ed from the following 
business, organizations and 
individuals: Beta Sigma Phi, 
K. D. Ford, Thriftway, Omega 
Grain, Dick DeArment, Linda 
Daughtry, E.A. Zybach, Ben 
Trout, Porter Rogers, Britt 
Ranch, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Britt, Grace Burke, Tom 
Christner, Paul Topper, H.S. 
Austin, Dean Tipps, Milton 
Finsterwald, Dorothy Hink, 
the American Legion Post #138 
and Alpha Mu Alpha Sorority. 

Memorial have been given 
in memory of Archie Hibler, 
Ora Bea Stiles and Beth Stiles. 

SANTA 
TO VISIT 
Santa Claus is coming 

to town!? But he won't be 
on his sleigh, he'll be on the 
firetruck and he will be at 
the courthouse from 1:00 
p.m. through the drawing. 
Pictures will be taken with 
Santa for $2.00 each with no 
limit on how many are in the 
picture. Alpha Mu Alpha 
and the Chamber of Com-
merce are sponsoring 
Santa's trip to Wheeler. 

CHRISTMAS MAILING TIPS 

r .4 

DONATION: Alpha Mu Alpha 
Sorority donated $200 toward 
the purchase of the Jaws-of-
life; the donation represents 
the proceeds from "The Gong 
Show" which the sorority re-
cently sponsored. The check 
was presented to Wheeler Fire 
Chief, Daryl Snelgrooes. 
$2565.00 has been contributed 

toward the purchase of the 
$7978.91 tool for use in re-
moving victims from automo-
bile accidents. Remember: All 
donations are tax deductible 
give to a worthy cause—it 
could save YOUR life. Donna 
Velasquez (left) and Marlene 
Miller are pictured above with 
Daryl Snelgrooes. 

Hylands Will 
Be Open Longer 

The first of four drawings 
sponsored by the Wheeler 
Merchants was held Saturday 
afternoon on the east side of 
the square with a large crowd 
in attendance. $300 was divid-
ed an placed into 16 en-
velopes; 14 people were pre-
sent to claim their envelopes 
when their names were drawn. 

The big winner for the day 
was Judy Alley; her name was 
drawn from the hopper twice. 
Judy claimed one of the ten 
$10 envelopes and remained at 
the drawing to claim one of the 
two $50 envelopes. 

Luke Horton was present at 
the 2:00 P.M. drawing and 
went home $20 richer after 
having his name drawn twice 
from the cylinder. Each time 
Luke received $10 in script. 

Five Tickets were unclaimed. 
A ticket worth $50 was 

drawn with the Charlie Pam 
Olyphant on the back; the 
ticket was unclaimed 	and 
placed back in the hopper for 
the three remaining drawings. 
Other unclaimed tickets drawn 
for $10 each were Jean 
Rhodes, Connie Porter, Nick SHOP LATE IN WHEELER THURS. 
..lkipital no/co the "Times " for a partial list 

of the bargains to be offered 
this evening in Wheeler for the 
late shoppers from 6 to 9 P.M. 

Weibe and Dena Brown. 
Those present to claim the 

$10 envelopes when their 
names were called were Joyce 
Thorton, JoAnne Davis, Jamie 
Kreyling, Judy Alley, 	Ed 
Jones, Luke Horton (twice), R. 
B. Mann, T. J. Cole and Jerry 
Don Horton, Jr. 

Each of the four $25 tickets 
were claimed 	immediately 
after the names were an-
nounced by Lyndon Loyd. 
Receiving envelopes from 
Chamber President Jay 
Thompson were Al Fancher, 
Glen Gaines, Janice Alley and 
Wanda Rodgers. 

Three tickets were drawn 
before the two envelopes con-
taining $50 in script, were 
handed to the lucky Wheeler 
shoppers. Receiving $50 were 
Ruth Mason and Judy Alley. 

Shoppers are to be remind-
ed of the rule for claiming the 
envelopes. Husband and wife 
may claim each other's en-
velopes, but children cannot 
claim their parents envelope 
no parents the children's win-
nings. 

Others assisiting with the 
drawing were Bobby Ware and 
Johnny Velasquez. 

Remember, Saturday, De-
cember 13 will be the second 
drawing and $300 will be 
divided into 16 envelopes and 
handed out to those present 
when their name is called. HEARING AID MAN 

AT SENIOR CITIZENS 
The Goebel Hearing Aid 

man will be at the Senior 
Citizens center, Thursday, 
December 11, 10:30-11:30 
A.M. 

SCS Requests 
Your Comments 

Hyland's Pharmacy an-
nounced a change in store 
hours for the holiday season. 
The store will remain open 
until 9:00 Thursday evenings 
and 6:30 on other business 
days until Christmas for the 
people who are working or 
unable to shop during the 
regular hours. 

With a selection of over 300 
gift items, the store has a sale 
under way with 30-40% off 
during the holiday season. 

A group of Wheeler Mer-
chants plan to remain open 
late on Thursday evening for 
your shopping convenience. 
The participating stores will be 
open until 9:00 P.M. 	on 
Dec. 4, 11 and 18. Fabulous 
bargains will be offered for 
those late evening shoppers. 

Those businesses informing 
the "Times" of their intent-
ions to remain open on Thurs-
day evening are Loyd's and 
Street's Ben Franklin, B.J.'s 
Wearhouse, The Dot Shop, 
and the Boutique. 

Be sure to check Page 3 of 

BUSINESS, RESIDENTIAL 
DECORATION CONTESTS 

47th Annual Farm Bureau Con. 

I • 

With the Christmas mailing 
season just ahead, the Post- 
master is offering some tips 
for customers to make sure 
their cards and packages arri-
ve on time and in good shape. 

In addition to shopping 
early, the Postmaster urges 
customers to properly address 
cards and packages with the 
name, street number and 
name or post office box num-
ber, and the city, state and ZIP 
Code reserved for the last line. 
It's also a good idea to put a 

slip of paper with the recip-
ient's name and address and 
your return address inside 
parcels. Be sure to include 
your return address including 
your ZIP Code on all envelopes 
and packages. 

The Postmaster also re-
minds customers to check the 
size of their envelopes before 
mailing Christmas cards. 
Letter size standards weigh 
went into effect last year 
require envelopes to be at 
least 3-1/2  inches high and 5 
inches long to be accepted for 
mailing. 

The Postal Service is also 
asking its customers to put an 
ounce of extra care into pre-
paring packages for mailing. 
Parcels will arrive at their 

James Guinn,Jr. 
Services Held 

destination in good shape if 
mailers follow a few simple 
instructions: 

1. Make sure the contents 
are well cushioned and there is 
no empty space in the box. 
Use crumpled newspaper aro-
und the item, on the bottom, 
the sides and on top of your 
gift. Foamed plastic shells 
and air pocket padding also 
are good cushions. 

2. Brown wrapping paper 
and twine cord are not neces-
sary. Wrappings can rip off, 
and twine can get caught in 
processing machinery. 

3. Use sealing tape to close 
off and seal the box. Three 
types are recommended: pre-
ssure-sensitive tape, kraft pa-
per reindorced with nylon or 
glass and filament-reinforced 
pressure-sensitive tape. Don't 
use masking tape or cello-
phane tape. They're no longer 
recommended due to past poor 
performance. 

4. Use a smudge-proof ink 
for the address which should 
appear in the lower right-hand 
corner of the box. Write your 
return address in the upper 
left-hand corner. Be sure to 
include the ZIP Code for both 
the addressee's address and 
your return address. 

5. Remove any other labels 
or addresses from the carton. 

6. Mail early in the month 
and mail early in the day to 
avoid the rush. 

7. Send irreplaceable articl-
es, cash and all valuable items 
by registered mail. 

The Great Plains Conserva-
tion Program, administrered 
by the Soil Conservation Ser-
vice of the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture through local con-
servation districts, has been 
extended by Congress for ten 
years. 

The public is encouraged to 
tell SCS officials about any 
changes they think should be 
made in the program which 
could result in more conserva-
tion being applied on the 
ground. 

Lavon Williams, 	District 
Conservationist for SCS at 
Wheeler, says that written 
comments should be sent to 
his office or the SCS State 
Office in Temple by Jan. 15. 
1981. Further information can 
be obtained by contacting him 
in person or by phone at 
826-5640. 

Hazel Parks Is 
Buried Tuesday 

SANTA LETTERS 
TO BE PUBLISHED 

Five voting delegates repre-
senting Wheeler County Farm 
Bureau recently participated 
in the 47th annual Texas Farm 
Bureau convention held Nov. 
30, Dec. 3 in San Antonio. 

They were Paul Macina, 
County president, Eddie 
George and wife, Helen; John 
W. Vermillion and wife, Pris-
cilla, directors. 

Policies directing the state's 
largest farm organization were 
adopted by more then 1,200 
delegates from 213 organized 
county Farm Bureaus during 
this meeting. Recommendat-
ions on national policies were 
also approved. These policies 
will advance to the American 
Farm Bureau Federation an-
nual meeting to be held Jan. 
11-15 in New Orleans. 

Speakers featured at the 

businessmen donated the 
$1300 to show their appreciat-
tion to their customers. 

Tickets will be available at 
all stores sponsoring the 
drawings. The businesses 
began giving the tickets Fri-
day, November 27. 

The first drawing was De-
cember 6 at 2:00 P.M. 

RULES CHANGED 
At a meeting of the Cham-

ber of Commerce Board of 
Directors Tuesday, Dec. 9, a 
vote was taken to change the 
rules for the drawing. The 
change makes anyone who 
shops in Wheeler eligible in 
the drawing. 

The rules formerly disquali-
fied "managers and owners 
(and their families) of all firms 
participating in the drawing". 
Employees of participating 
firms were ineligible 	for 
tickets from the business in 
which they worked and mer-
chants not participating in the 
drawing also ineligible. 

Remember, each time you 
enter a participating store you 
are entitled to a ticket; ask for 
it, sign it, deposit the tickets in 
the containers which are con-
veniently located in the spon-
soring firms. 

You will receive one ticket 
per each dollar purchase up to 
a maximum of $500.00. 

When the day of the draw-
ing arrives, all of the tickets 
will be placed in a large 
container and the winners 
drawn. You MUST be present 
to win. However, husbands 
and wives may claim each 
other's prizes. 

SPONSORS 
The Dot Shop, 	Albert's 

Shamrock, Times Fashions, 
Ware Chevrolet, B. J.'s Wear-
house, Lee Hardware, L & F 
Repair, The Boutique, Frank- 
enbery Texaco, 	Thriftway, 
Wheeler Flower Shop, Cross 
Car Center, Ben Franklin, 
Koshare Shop, Harvey's 
Family Restaurant, Mc-
Ilhany's Dry Goods, Pete Bur-
ton Ford, Wheeler Lumber Co. 
Blue Stamp Store, Pierce's 
Trading Post, Wheeler Auto 
Center, Hyland's Parmacy. 

The following merchants are 
participating but are not giv-
ing tickets: 
Sparlins, Baker Automotive, 

Lewallen Ins. Agency, Wil-
mart, Beef Cattle Company, 
First National Bank in Wheel-
er, Production Credit Associa-
tion, Hibler Implement, 
Wright Funeral Home, Whee-
ler Redi Mix, Wheeler Co-op, 
J & J Shamrock, Rives Insur-
ance Agency, Wheeler Gas 
Inc., Southwestern Public Ser-
vice, Hampton's 66 Truck 
Stop, R. C. Callan. 

convention included Carrol 
Chaloupka of Dalhart, TFB 
president; Mayo J. Thompson 
of Houston, noted free enter-
prise advocate; Warren New-
berry of Waco, TFB executive 
director; and Donald Hebert of 
Waller, TFB secretary-treas-
urer. 

The business session cover-
ed the final two days of the 
meeting. The last order of 
business was the election of 
directors and the president. 
The 1981 president is Paul 
Macina. 

County leaders also attend-
ed several special conferences 
during the convention. Con- 
ference 	topics 	included 
energy, farm program, taxes, 
transportation, meat product-
ion, and Farm Bureau ser-
vices. 

Old Admissions 
10-22 Frankie Cason 
11-1 	John Haning 
11-4 Luke Ray Alexander 
11-5 Claude Crouch 
11-13 Richard Kysar 
11-15 Geneva Harris 
11-27 Allene Holt 
11-29 Ruth Douglas 
11-30 Walter Cooper 
New Addmissions 
12-3 Ann Gandy 
12-4 Rosemary Banks 

Jim Walker 
Vena Richardson 

12-5 	011ie Jaco 
Hestell Killingsworth 
Grace Porter 
Heather Honeycutt 
Heath Honeycutt 
Jimmy Selby 
Shirley Ivey 

12-6 	Curtis Kidwell 
Olive Waldo 
Allen Hickey 

12-7 Mike Honeycutt 
12-8 	Lucille Tipps 

Lewis Wright 
Vera Lester 
Caryn Risner 
Jodie Daniels 

12-0 	Violet Burch 
Dismissals 
12-3 	Mike Gallagher 

Zora Sanders 
12-4 Grady Dodd 

Herman Miller 
Irene Rogers 
Caryn Risner 
Ben Tedder 
Bernice Tedder 

12-5 Walter Cooper 
12-6 Ann Gandy 

James Walker 
12-7 Heath Honeycutt 

Heather Honeycutt 
12-8 Jimmy Selby 

Mary Grayson 
Allen Hickey 
Grace Porter 

12-9 	Shirley Ivey 
Rosemary Banks 
Caryn Risner 

New Arrival 

The Christmas Season is 
upon us and it is time to start 
thinking about getting out the 
decorations. The street de-
corations are put into position 
and the Chamber of Com-
merce will again sponsor a 
Christmas Decoration Contest. 

Each resident owner is ask-
ed to decorate their home by 
December 19th and our secret 
judges will begin judging the 
decorations on that date. The 
first place home decoration 
contest winner will receive 
$25.00 from the Chamber of 
Commerce and the second 
place winner will receive 
$15.00. The first and second 
place prize winners will have 
their pictures and a picture of 
their home in the Wheeler 
Times and be honored at the 
Chamber of Commerce ban-
quet. 

Wheeler businesses are also 
asked to decorate their win-
dows and inside their store to 
be judged beginning Decem-
ber 13. 

The business that wins first 
will receive a large plaque to 
be displayed in their store for 
one year. The second place 
business winner will receive a 
plaque to be displayed in their 
store. They will be honored at 
the Chamber banquet. 

To make this project a great 
success the citizens of 
Wheeler must all put fourth an 
effort to help make Wheeler 
the most beautifully decorated 
city in the Panhandle. 

For those living in the 
immediate Wheeler area, the 
Chamber has placed a two 
mile limit on the contest. 
Persons living within two 
miles of the city limits are 
iligible to enter the contest. 

SANTA CLAUS 
TO VISIT 

Santa Claus has schedul-
ed a visit in Wheeler. He 
will make his appearance at 
the Rogue Theatre on 
Saturday, December 20 im-
mediately following the 
Chamber of Commerce 
Drawing at 2:00. 

After all the youngsters 
have had a chance to visit 
with Santa, the Rogue 
Theatre will offer a free 
matinee. The feature will be 
a new release, "Nutcrack-
er's Fantacy", with Dick 
VanPatton, JoAnn Worley, 
Christopher Lee and Ava 
Gabor. 

to right): Helen George, Mrs. 
John Vermillion, second row 
(left to right): Paul Macina, 
County Presidnt, Eddie 
George, John Vermillion. 

TRAP SHOOT 
Voting Delegates repre-

senting Wheeler County Farm 
Bureau at the 47th annual 
Texas Farm Bureau convent-
ion in San Antonio, Nov. 30, 
Dec. 3 included front row (left 

Hey Kids-Christmas is just 
around the cornor and Santa 
Claus is so busy at the North 
Pole in his toy shop that he has 
asked the "Times" to help 
him out with his Christmas 
mail. 

All you little boys and girls 
through the third grade are 
asked to help Santa also by 
sending your letters to Santa 
Claus to the "Wheeler Times" 
to be published. 

Teachers, if you would like 
to help the children with their 
letters as a class project, 
please see that the letters are 
clearly printed and that they 
reach the "Times" office on 
time. 

Ole Santa will read all the 
letters in one issue, thus 
cutting down on his mail. Also 
you won't be taking a chance 
of your letter getting lost in the 
snow. 

Kids, read these instruct-
ions carefully. Write your let-
ter, using 30 words or less. . 

Continued Page 7 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Davis of 
Wheeler are proud to announ-
ce the arrival of thier son, 
David Michael David Jr. He 
arrived Sun., Nov. 23 at 10:50 
a.m. at Parkview Hospital. He 
weighed 8 lbs. 71/2  ozs. and 21 
inches long. Sharing in this 
joyous event are his grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Childress of Gate, Okla. and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jess Davis of 
Twitty, Texas, also his great 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Markham and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Childress of 
Wheeler. 

Sunday, December 14. The 
shoot will begin at 1:00 p.m. 

The range is located 6 miles 
west and 4 miles north of 
Wheeler. 

The Wheeler Lions Club will 
hold a trap shoot at the range 

James Theodore Guinn, Jr.. 
57, died Saturday, November 
30, 1980 in Panhandle, Texas. 

Services were held Monday, 
December 1 at 10:30 in Car- 
michael-Whatley 	Funeral 
Directors Colonial Chapel in 
Pampa. Rev. Jim Shamburger, 
pastor of First Baptist Church 
in White Deer, and Rev. 
Jerome Hogan, pastor of First 
Baptist Church in Wheeler, 
officiated. Burial was in the 
Memory Gardens Cemetery in 
Pampa. 

Mr. Guinn was born in 
Higgins. He moved to White 
Deer in 1953 and to St Anni 
Nursing Home in Panhandle in 
1973. He was a member of the 
Veterans of Foreign Wars Post 
1657 of Pampa, the Masonic 
Lodge of Bishop, and the First 
Baptist Chruch in White Deer. 
He had been employed 15 
years at Celanese. 

He married Mona Jean 
Luttrell Baker on June 22, 
1947 in Hereford. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Mona; three sons, David M. 
Guinn of Austin, John Paul 
Guinn of Dallas and the Rev. 
Stanley Baker 	of Snyder, 
Oklahoma; a daughter, Mrs. 
Cherry Ann Body of Dickson, 
Tenn.; his father, J. T. Guinn 
Sr., of Hereford; two sisters, 
Mrs. June Skidmore of Sham-
rock and Mrs Dorothy Black-
well of Houston; and seven 
grandchildren. 

Mrs. Hazel Rebecca 
Parks, 67, died December 6. 

Services were held 2:30 
p.m. Tuesday, December 9, 
at the First United Metho-
dist Chruch, Rev. Ernie 
McGaughey, pastor, off-
iciated. Burial was in 
Wheeler Cemetery by 
Wright Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Parks was born in 
Henderson and moved to 
Wheeler County in 1919. 
She was a member of the 
First United Methodist 
Church. 

She married Luther Parks 
on July 21, 1929 in Erick, 
Oklahoma. He preceded her 
in death in 1971. 

Survivors include two 
sons, Garland Parks of Al-
buquerque, N.M., and 
Richard Parks of New York 
City; a brother, Gordon 
Roper of Wheeler; a half 
sister, Mrs. Lela Wilson of 
Pampa; and three grand-
children. 

Pallbearers were Riley 
Atwood, Leon Fillingim, 
Dub Goad, Thomas Helton, 
Harold Nash, James Ver-
den. 



Thoheelie 
throughout the U.S. and 
Canada as well as overseas. 
Another successful Foundat-
ion for Christian Living pro-
gram is the School of Practical 
Christianity, which attracts 
ministers and spouses from all 
parts of the country to its three 
annual sessions. 

Margaret said, "this was 
one of the most wonderful 
experiences of her life and too 
beautiful to believe 	They Ili 
arrived back home on Decem- 
ber 2. 

Ii 

k
eel:\ Kodak paper. For a Good Look at the Times 
• • 	of Your Life. TM  

Mon., December 15 

9  KING SIZE 99  
WALLET 

CREATIVE 
COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY 

HOLIDAY TRIP ACCI-
DENT policies with optional 
luggage insurance are 
available for your protect-
ion, at Rives Insurance 
Agency. 
Two Storage Barns located 
on Hwy. 152. 

RIVES 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 

115W. Texas 
826-5224 or 826-5202 

C 1980 COLUMBIA PICTURES INOUSTRIES. INC 

ROGUE M SHOW pTJAIM.  E 

One Week! Dec. 12-18 

EACH TUESDAY IS BARGAIN wheeler, Texas 79096 

NIGHT...ALL SEATS SI. 	 '806) 826 3078 

Realty t Southwest 
HOUSE W/1 Acre of land. 
city utilities & city water. 
Along with nice orchard. 
Priced to sell. 
Investment Property - Still 
remaining 2 - 100' x 150' 
lots. 

Two Storage Barns located 

on Hwy. 152. 

County Laving on Five acres 
W/2600 sq. ft. House. 2 
Water Wells and Commer-
cial Barn. Priced to sell. 

Easy to Love 
This cozy two bedroom 

house on Commanche is 
too-oo Easy To Love. It has 
a lovely price also. Come in 
and see us about it. 

THE SECRET 
Owner's moving & must sell 
their 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 
large utility, centeral heat, 
two car garage. An Afford-
able Home. 

= WE NEED YOUR LISTINGS! = 

	

John Norman, Broker 	806 826-5202-Office 

	

I  Don Rives, Salesman 	 826-3283-Home 

BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 

Beef processed, double wrapped 1911 per pound 

lc A Pound for Butchering 

Pork Processing including curing 
Double wrapped 22e per pound 

$8.50 a head for butchering 

We butcher Mon., Tues., Thurs., & Fri. until 11:30 A.M. 

CALL FOR QUARTER—HALF—WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK AND BEEF FOR SALE 

SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 
North of City 
	 Phone: 256.2241 

C los irg at Noon on Saturday 

WHEN A HEARING 
AID WkL HELP 

BELTONE HEARING AID SERVICE 
. 10am-1 pm 

TUES., DEC. 16, 1980 

Substantial interest penalty required for 
early withdrawal from certificates of deposit. 

SECURITY FEDERAL SAVINGS...FOR SECURITY! 

Security Federal Savings 
and Loan Association 

PAMPA: West Francis at Gray HEREFORD: 1017 W. Park Avenue 

AMARILLO: 15th and Polk. 45th and Teckla, 31055. Georgia 

MEMBER FSLIC 
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Margaret Trout, Daughter Enjoy Trip vision messages by Dr. Peale 
to stations across America. 

Dr. and Mrs. Peale prepare 
a weekly column, THERE'S 
AN ANSWER!, which goes to 
more than 600 newspapers 

1980 
her name is Monica Ann. 

Mobeetie would like to wel-
come Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Hogan, our new deputy 
sheriff. They are living in the 
Alan Hale residence. We are 
proud to have you. 

people in 120 countries. It 
maintains a prayer fellowship 
and sponsors radio and tele- The baby was born to Mr. and 

Mrs. Danny Luman, Odessa, 
Texas. Born November 29 and 

Mrs. Margaret Trout of 
Mobeetie, her daughter 
Helen Mixon of Amherst, Tx. 
flew to Hawaii to attend the 
seventh Thanksgiving "family 
reunion" of friends and sup-
porters of the Foundation for 
Christian Living led by Nor-
man Vincent Peale. 

Arrived Nov. 24 to join Dr. 
Peale and his wife, Ruth 
Stafford Peale, their children 
and grandchildren for a week a 
fellowship, spiritual renewal 
and recreation at the Sheraton 
Waikiki Hotel. 

The program included ses-
sions devoted to prayer, Bible 
study, sharing, financial plan-
ning and health—with time for 
sightseeing, shopping and re-
creation. 

A high point in the reunion 
was an old-fashion Thanks-
giving dinner featuring a talk 
by Lowell Thomas Jr. Dr. 
Peale preached at the Sunday 
Worship Service. 

In addition to Dr. and Mrs. 
Peale, those featured on the 
program included Vonda Van 
Dyke Scoates, a former Miss 
America, local Hawaiian of-
ficials and celebrities, the 
famous Honolulu Boy Choir 
and members of the staff of 
the Foundation for Christian 
Living and of Marble Colle-
giate Church in New York, 
where Dr. • Peale has been 
senior minister for 48 years. 

forgot a present for 
Emma" 

The first reunion, in 1974, 
was held in Hawaii, and the 
"family" returned again for 
Thanksgiving 1977. Other re-
unions have taken place in 
Bermuda, Mexico City, New 
York and the Bahamas. 

The Foundation for Chris-
tian Living, established 40 
years ago by Mrs Peale, 
distributes the sermons and 
writings of Dr. Peale and 
inspirational literature by 
others to more than 750,000 

ctineo from 
Linda Doughtty, CEA (Home Economics) 
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Today's 
Security Rates. 

15.319 
6-Month Money Market C.D. 

$10,000 minimum deposit required. 

Rate effective through Dec. 17, 1980 

12.00% 

iK 

Big Game—Nutritious Eating 
First in a series. 

Big game provides variety 
and contributes high quality 
nutrients to meals of families 
of Texas sportsmen. 

Utilization of this wild game 
aids conservation of a valuable 
resource and can stretch the 
food budget year round. 

Big game also fits into the 
meat group of the basic four 
food groups. 

Like domestic meat, it is rich 
in protein, minerals and vita-
mins. 

There is one difference 
through — it is generally low 
in fat. Serving size is two to 
three ounces of lean meat. 

Meat of big game furnishes 
protein needed for growth and 
repair of body tissues, mus-
cles. blood, skin and hair. It 
also provides iron. thiamin, 
riboflavin and niacin. 

For those who prefer to have 
their deer meat made into 
sausage, here are some deer 
sausage recipes. 

Since there are many pre-
ferences for different flavors 
and textures, adapt these re- 

to  

HEARING AID 
SERVICE CENTER 

(Shamrock Texan 
1 1  5 No Main 

Shamrock Texas 

GoIdle Gordon 
Mr. 	and Mrs. La Wayne 

Hogan and Bonnie Hogan 
from Pampa and family 
visited with Jess and Gazelle 
Patterson on their way home 
from Manhattan. Kansas. 
They had visited Mrs. Bob 
Helton who is the farmer 
LaVada Hogan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tink Ingram 
visited last Sunday afternoon 
with old friends Mr. and Mrs. 
E. F. Lester. 

Edgar Lester's brother Mr. 
Claude Lester from McLean 
visited Monday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lester. 

Visiting with Gene Gudgel 
in St. Anthonys Hospital were 
Maries sister Mrs. Reba Blair 
from Booker and the children 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Bennon 
and family from Midland and 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Gudgel 
from Oklahoma City. Tuesday 
visitors in the Gene Gudgel 
home were Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Helton. 

Bob and Bessie Galmor 
were in Shamrock last 
Wednesday visiting their son 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobbie Galmor 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hamilton 
and family held a traditional 
Thanksgiving dinner for their 
family and relatives those 
attending were Mr. and Mrs. 
H. H. Chevalier, Dee Allan, 
Genie and Tammy Noller, 
Jimmy and Carolyn McLeod 
Cody and Sandy, Billie Pat 
Underwood and Jana Hol-
lingsworth. 

Mrs. Nancy Shelton and 
Teresa, Mr. and Mrs. Jackie 
May, Don and Armanda, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Newman. Chad 
and Toby from Elk City were 
Thanksgiving guests in the 
home of Mrs. Odessa Carwile 
in Pamp,a. 

Believe it or not but Pauline 
Hooker is the proud great 
grandmother of another baby 
girl. This is her seventh one. 

Ft. Elliott Club 
Holds Meeting kO 

LIMIT 
The club met on Dec 2nd in 

the home of Gazelle Patterson. 
Gazelle presided over the 
meeting as the president, 
Margaret Trout was visiting in 
Hawaii. LaVerne Scribner 
presented the devotional fol-
lowed with the club collect by 
Elnita Atkins. Edith Sims pre-
sented the program "50 years 
with women of the Air Force." 

Due to several members 
moving away the club would 
appreciate any women who are 
interested to come meet with 
them. 

The following were served 
refreshments by Mrs. Patter-
son, Edith Sims, Eula John-
son, Elnita Atkins, LaVerne 
Scribner. 

a 

Extra 
Charge 

for 
GROUPS 
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r 12.93 
% 
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30-Month Treasury Rate C.D. 
Only $100 minimum deposit required! 

IP  COME TO CHRISTMAS WirELER 

OF COFFEE ANU LE T U5 GIFTS BROWSE, HAVE A CUP 

HELP WITH YOUR SHOPPING 

SURE TO PLEASE 
14 K Yellow Gold 
Man's .30 tw Diamond 

HORSESHOE RING 550cm 
Open Thursday Nite 6-9 P.M. 

BEN FRANKLIN®  
LOYD'S & STREET'S, Inc. 

408 S. Main 	Phone: 826-5868 
Wheeler, Texas 

111 BSI 100AR PAM 

GE1 	lUIES MADE Of GIAII0PA. 

GLUON& DAD, NOR AID 11.1 lilt 

IlnlF OBIS AI NM SAM/ IOW P9ICIS,  

0 
PHOTOS 
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Inc. ASK 
About Our 
TM12 
8 X 10 
OFFER 
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cipes to please individual 
tastes. 

Fresh Breakfast Sausage 
25 pounds lean deer, antelope 

or elk meat 
25 pounds very fresh regular 

pork trimmings (50 percent 
lean, 50 percent fat) 

1 pound salt 
11/2 -2 ounces ground sage 
11/2 -2 ounces black pepper 
1/2  ounce red pepper (if 

desired) 
5 ounces sugar 

For Small Quantities 
2 pounds wild game meat 
2 pounds regular pork 

trimmings 
2 teaspoons salt 
4 teaspoons ground sage 
2 teaspoons ground black 

pepper 
%-1/2  teaspoon red pepper (if 

desired) 
1 teaspoon sugar 

Throughly mix trimmings, 
and grind through a plat with 
'/2 inch holes. 

Spread coarsely ground 
meat on table top, sprinkle 
seasoning on top and tho-
roughly mix. Regrind through 
a plate with 1/8 inch-holes. 

If a '/2 inch plate is not 
available, sprinkle seasoning 
on top of trimmings, throughly 
mix and grind once through a 
plate with 1/8 inch holes. 

For stuffed sausage, stuff 
immediately for best results. 
Stuff into natural hog casings,. 
plastic bags or muslin bags 
(use any cloth bag made from 
strong cloth that has been 
washed several times.) 

Obtain natural hog casings 
from meat markets, local meat 
processing plants or stores. 

Soak them in warm, salty 
water for about one hour or 
until they are pliable. 

If bulk sausage is to bp. 
served soon after making, add 
3/4 cup of water to about four 
pounds of sausage. Knead 
with hands until sausage be-
comes sticky. 

Pack tightly in small molds, 
pans or cans and chill over-
night before slicing. 

Cured and Smoked Sausage 
[Country Style] 

371/2  pounds of deer, antelope 
or elk meat 

Continued Page 3 

cRICAC MAK OW AVAICAVOIERWAVAC WM OW MOW MICANCOW DIAMOND EARRINGS 

,10 tVi (2 Stones) 
a: 	.54 ct tw Clusters Oristmas 6urtings 

MANY PRICES N BETWEEN 

Serpentine 
Neck Chains 	from 35 

.14 K. Yellow Gold 

1.48 ct 	Sapphire 
R I N G 200°° .06 ct. Diamond 

Large Selection 14 K Gold 

00 

Rate effective through r•ec. 24, 1980 

iegetiand FASHIONS 
50% Off 

An Unusual Gift Item Phone 806/669-7776 	 1543 North Hobart 

PAMPA, TEXAS 79065 

"We Understand Fashion and You" 

'-uf•taanfisietwexiscvetracrerstuAcigckincwwwsactricragstsitirtAmbu:r.ctufraurists.ostssostv.sistinmerz 

JUNIORS (SIZES 3-13) 

15145A5SCSV411165A534v5M6721:5a5A5-641WWMOV10)404140ft13010 

LARGE SELECTION 

1st Promise Rings 	50% off 
Wedding Sets 

LARGE SELECTION UNUSUAL 

Brass Accessories 	n  
HOOKS, SPITTOONS, LAMPS, 25 /0 
BATH ACCESSORIES, KITCHEN 
ACCESSORIES  \ 

t Lovely Handmade Black Hills Gold Jewelry 1/2  

Off 
N. ngs, Tie Tacs, Bracelets 

Affordable Gift Idea 

Pendants, Ear Rings, Ri 

A Most Unusual 

BOYS (THRU SIZE 18) 

ALL JEWELRY IN THE 
STORE AT LEAST 50% OFF 

PRICED MARKED 

Large Selection 

Indian 
Jewelry 

GIRLS 

LADIES (SIZES 6-16) 

INFANTS 

eritilatAS WX‘tfat'SVAg et A: fa AL' fatai SIC USW ACUS SC USW °AN .n• 7; 71SNAP; Pic"; 7$7;7; It; 7,1: 71: 

Open Evenings 'til 8:00 p.m. (Dec. 1 thru Dec. 23) 

GIFT CERTIFICATES FREE GIFT WRAPPING Rings, Bracelets. 
Necklaces, Buckles, etc. 

JCoihare 

_Slop  
Fine Jewelry 

Gifts of Distinction 
1303 Alan Bean Blvd 

Wheeler, Texas 

OPEN 10:00 A.M. to 5:30 P.M. 

SO% off "Ve 4afte vows kite:day guadan will Ge a octet were, otter 
Free Gift Wrappin 

CLAKIRVNPANSLIMALRatil‘ &etetillecreatneteovtenna.ana err.: MSc an-nrina_•anath-atacte....1,-.cnt lama .naanciaanas, mertIlln maw enlfrttaw 



Tourers Finishes 
Oro. 

Move Drcos 
Worm 
300 Dross %A ye 
WM* Moe 

LEE Hardware & Furniture 
Phone 826-5532 Wheeler le.., 

FAN SEEM 
	

Ortire rpm] w croWl 
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RIM 

BLADES 
	

SY Spin MO MOM 
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mor tiOes 

HAMER 
	

NM la 0w1 mum° 
end crow  eddei 

SWICUT 	 30 la 

The ancients believed the 
emerald had the power to 
heal diseases of the eye. 

NOT FROZEN 

FROM IKE ISOM 
TO YOU 
40113..0 NO • 4244004.04. 

between Froth A Fr. & 

THE OLD FISHERMAN CAUGHT ANOTHER TOAD 

447411141  
1.44MNP4110MBI. 

10 % 

OFF 
ON 10-LBS. 
OR MORE 

INMENINNBONIIPI 

SATURDAY ONLY — DECEMBER 13 
2:00 to 6:00 P.M. 

Location: 	COURT HOUSE SQUARE 	WHEELER, TEXAS 
Will be in Shamrock 

10:00 A.M. to 1:00 P.M. 

LOBSTERS 

SCALLOPS 

BLUE CRAB MEAT 

Rattlesnake Meat 

FRESH RED SNAPPER 
FRESH FLOUNDER 
BREADED SHRIMP 
KING CRAB LEGS 
FRESH OYSTERS 

FRESH TROUT 
FROG LEGS 
CALF FRIES 
FILLET OF COD 

-tAIII4M511 
kg.tt 

PERMS ON SALE 
every Thursday 
In December 

$50 Perms $25 
$25 Perms $18 

Shop is open until 9:00 P.M. on Thursdays 
REDKIN PRODUCTS 	Phone: 826-3168 

BEN 	FRAN KLIN®  

T LOYD'S & STREET'S, Inc. 
408 S. Main 	Phone: 826-5868 

Wheeler, Texas 

P 0 Box 208 

-The Spot for Fashion- 

Phone: 806/826-3111 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

For the 
PL3y1eX International Collection 

0 

0 

OFF 

All WINTER DRESSES 
& JEANS 

The Dot Shop 

ONSFRI1 

WORK 1 /q Price 
SHOES 	. / L 	IVO 00/ 

Eskiloo 
OVERSHOES $1 000  

LadieslAiss Piggy' 7 0 0 
NIGHTGOWNS 

Winter 1  /2  SHOES 	 Price 
Ladies' , ,„6\ 
SPORTSWEAR 	Kit"  

GREAT SELECTION OF 	:UtZN  

Lingerie 	'PLATTER 

Corduroy 	$200 
FREE GIFT WRAP 

WEAR HOUSE Inc 
Phonei.  806/826-5524 , 

410 South Main 
P.O. Box 449 	' 

• WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

ANF 

A. "Apache" Buck, 18.00 

B. Perky" Bone, 15.00 
C. "Capri-  Gold, 14.75 

D "Dormie", Gold. White, 13.00 
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1 ounce saltpeter (potassium 	ounce ground nutmeg, if 
nitrate — obtain at drug 	desired) 

store) 	 % ounce galric powder (if 
2 ounces black pepper 	 desired) 
Vs ounce ground cloves (or 	Prepare and grind meat,  

and add seasonings as for dry for 24 to 48 hours at a make cured and smoked saus- 
fresh sausage. 	 temperature of 38-40 degrees age. 

Stuff into natural hog cm- F. 	 SMOKING: Smoke 	the 
ings or muslin casings. Hang 	The Fresh Breakfast Saus- sausage one to two hours or 
or place on racks to cure, and age recipe can also be used to 	until light brown color is  

obtained. 
(NEXT WEEK: Big Game 

Sausage — Smiking, Storing) 
Educational programs con-

ducted by the Texas Agricul- 

tural Extension Service serve 
people of all ages regarldless 
of socio-economic level, race. 
color, sex, religion or national 
origin. 

Lines 	From Page 2 

12% pounds of very fresh pork 

'‘ fat trimmings (fatback) 
1 pound salt n  Alpha Mu Alpha 

Dec. Meeting 
The Alpha Mu Alpha 

chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
met Monday, December 8 at 
7:30 p.m. in the home of 
Diane Trussell with Diane 
serving as hostess and Carol 
Porton as co-hostess. 

A business meeting was 
held in which plans were 
discussed for the sorority's 
Christmas party and for 
Santa pictures. 

Members attending were: 
Marlene Miller, Carol Por- 

THE RITZ "TANGIERS" 	 ton. Deedy Zybach, Diane 
Trussell, Donna Rives, Car-
letta Burton. Margaret Do-
rman, Belinda Masters, 
Debbie Perry, Melonia Sim-
mons, and Donna Velas-
quez. 

NORCO 

Tore. wries d Me ceinj W. bras az mow sr Mon se for Imerm 
temp az a Mem Mem burl No moo Melho on doe lneArp 

rnd • s_a NM. as F.1 Immo ardym.0,m Me maw to 

STAN.. FEATURES 

ELECTRICAL 

The Boutique 412 Main 

THURSDAY EVENING 
IN WHEELER 6-9  P.M. 

Thurs.Nite Half Price Sale Wheeler, Texas 

UNDEROOS 
Re 
3=49 $2.50 	 

1/2  
Price 

WOMEN'S 

Plush Boots 
5.47 $2.75 . 

Thursday Nite Only . • . (Dec. 4 from ( to 9 P.M.) 

BLOUSES & JEANS 	$3.00  
Make-Up Bags 	$3.95  

20% Off on Ladies' COATS 

All Toys 
/ 1 ,2 Price 

Christmas 

LATCH HOOK 
Wall Hanging Kits 

Reg S12 & 518 

POLAROID 
ONE-STEP 

CAMERA $2999 
Reg. 35.95 

TOYTOWN SALE 
Still In 
	 Progress 

Thursday Night Only Vagiet atm  
For gifts ... for you too! 

Givenchy 
Underdressings* 

ame irmaionrra aenema 	 • • 



FOR SALE 
By Owner 

3 Br—large master Br, liv-
ing room, den, utility room, 
11/2  bath, new carpet, new 
appliances; central H/A. 
Good location for appoint-
ment call 826-3065. 

WANTED: Female Concession 
Help. Must be willing to work 
Friday and Saturday nights. 
Apply in person. 	Rogue 
Theatre. Phone: 826-3078. rtn 

Vint. HAUL 
TREE LIMBS 

FURNITURE 

JUNK 

Will haul after school 
Saturdays. 

•:. 
Day Phone: 826-3123 

Evenings & Saturdays 
Phone 826-3221 

x 

Or 

LADY VENUS: Aloe Vera 
Cosmetics now available at the 
City Cleaners & Fabrics. Call 
for free facial and skin treat- 
ment. 826-3268. 	rtn 

FOR SALE: 1978 Honda 400 
automatic, less than 1600 
miles. $1400, 826-5274. 	rtn 

CAKES 
CATERING SERVICE FOR 
Wedding & Anniversaries 

Cathy Hunt-375-2391 
Kay Luttrell-375-2421 

WAITRESS WANTED: Apply 
at Sparlin's Restaurant. 	rtn 

MINERAL & ROYALTY 
I am interested in purchas-
ing your minerals or royalty 
acres. Would like to Trade 
surface of the SW'/. Sec 38, 
Blk A-4 for 80 mineral acres 
in Wheeler County. Bill 
Spillman, Wheeler Oil Co., 
Box 832. Wellington, 806- 
447-2525. 	 rtn 

FOR SALE: 10-10 Tire chang-
ing machine, rebuilt. $150. 
Cross Car Center. 826-5512. 

rtn 

.........wreMs.wiNo 

I ENERGY 
APPLIANCES 

Ceiling Fans 
tr: A SC 0 — Reversable fir 

5-Year Warranty 

ENCO— c-7ear Warranty 
cm of 9/1/130 

Wood Burning Stoves 
c all: E. M. RIVES 

806/256-5250 	or 
Shamrock. Texas 

I 

I 

I 

MRS. BETTY RIVE 
806/826-2224 
Wheeler, Texas 

sol,...m ..11. P.orna 	 .ges 

1 

WESTERN 
For 
needs! 

all your 

111 	

IIIIIIIJ 

INSULATION 
insulation . 

- 
— 

Satisfaction 
Phone: 

Free 

806/826-3170 

Estimates 
Guaranteed 

r 	Ng 	 a 	till 

SALE Avon Christmas 
Open House 

Starting Dec. 9 until ? 
1000 Alan Bean Blvd. 

9:00 til 9:00 
Mona Guinn, 

Avon Representive 
Phone: 826-5945 

MEMBER 1980 

TEXAS P 
	

ASS9C1A1I0N 

FUR BUYER 
Fur buyer will be in Wheel-
er at Hamptons 66 each 
Wednesday from 7:00 A.M. 
till 7:45 A.M. beginning 
Dec. 10. 

We buy green and dry 
furs of all kinds. Skin case 
all fur (like Opossum), not 
open up the middle. We 
also buy deer hides and 
RATTLESNAKE SKINS. 
Well handled furs bring 
TOP PRICES! 
Northwestern Fur Company 

241 Walnut Street 
Colorado City, Texas 79512 

Phone: 915-728-2295 

JUST ARRIVED: Christmas 
Albums, Cassettes, 8-track or 
L.P. $2.99 up. L. & F. Repair. 

HELP WANTED: 	House- 
cleaning, Call Mrs. Tom 
Christner, 826-5742. 	rtn 

YARD SALE: 602 Osage. 
weather permiting, Saturday, 
Dec. 13, 9:00 till 5:00. 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO 
CHANGE RATES 

Greenbelt Electric Coopera-
tive, Inc. has filed a request 
with the Public Utility Com-
mission of Texas for permiss-
ion to change its retail rates 
effective December 15, 1980, 
or as otherwise directed by the 
commission. The classes of 
consumers to be affected are 
as follows: residential, irrigat-
ion, small commercial, large 
commercia, and security 
lights. The proposed rates 
would produce an additional 
$126,457.00 in revenue based 
upon the twelve month period 
ending March 31, 1980 as to 
adjusted test year. This repre-
sents an increase in the ad-
justed gross operating re-
venues of the utility of approx-
imately 7.28%. 

Polish television shows 
about 38 hours a 
week of programming. 

WHEELER ACREAGE: 1/2 
minerals; Fruit, nut orchard; 
Alfalfa; house, barn, well, 
machinery. Some financing. 
Immediate possession. Golden 
Spread Real Estate. 935-3300, 
935-4736. 935-4498. 	4tc 

HOLCOMB 

Trailer Park 
West 12th Street 

Phone 806/826-5810 
or 827-5942 

FOR SALE: 3 bedrooms, 21/2  
bath, living room, den large 
utility room, basement, all 
carptedted on 5 acres. 1601 W. 
12th st. Good out buildings 
and fence. Phone: 826-5810 rtn 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 
Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler, Texas 

STORM-SCREEN 
WINDOWS 

Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable from inside. Easy t 
c lean„prow ler-proof . Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills..,. 

WHEELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826.5543 Wheeler, Tex. 

.-7 ine Service for Fine People 

• 

Let Me Write It . . 

GEO. RICHARDSON 

All Types Of 
INSURANCE 
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1 
Wr.•-  t Ads  Court Records WELDERS 

MACHINISTS 
ELECTRICIANS 

WELDER TRAINEES 

OIL & GAS PROPERTIES 

MARK BURRELL 
	

A. W. BURRELL 
Box 23 
	

Route 1 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 

	
TwIlly, Texas 79090 

806/826-3208 
	

806/256-2069 If you have good work record on your 
current job you may find one of our 
openings just fits your career plans. 
Call or write for more information: 

806-665-3701 ask for Ernie Willis MARY KAY 1  
COSMETICS INGERSOLL-RAND OILFIELD PRODUCTS COMPANY 

P.O. Box 1101 
Pampa, Texas 79065 New Consulant 

BARBARA PYT:R 
Ask about our: 

Complete company paid benefits 
package (including Dental Insurance) 

Salary that fits your skills 
Potential for advancement 
Excellent working environment 

Phone: 826-3091 
Free Facials — Supplies — 

Deliveries 
FOR SALE: 1977 Ford L.T.D. 
Good tires, 60,000 miles. One 
owner, James Verden, Phone: 
806/826-5965. 	 rtn 

FOR SALE: 681/2  acres land, 
near Wheeler. Phone: 
1-714/885-7442, Ken Crow- 
der. 	 rtn 

LIST OF INTR1UMENTS FIL-
ED IN THE OFFICE OF THE 
COUNTY CLERK AND DIS-
TRICT CLERK OF WHEELER 
COUNTY, TEXAS FROM DEC 
1 THRU DEC 5, 1980 
DECEMBER 1, 1980A0L--J B 
Mattax to Cities Service Co 
10-20-80 NE% Sec 50 BIk A-5 
4 AOL--Vise Engergy, Inc to 
Lowell Lasley 11-27-80 E1/2  Sec 
39 A-4 
2 ASSIGN OVERRID ROY--
Dennis L Holt et us and from S 
Gene Hall et ux to Lyons & 
Lyons, Inc 12-1-78 Secs 66, 67 
Pt 65 Blk A-5 
OD & RDO--Triton Oil & Gas 
Corp to Triangle Drilling Co 
Inc 11-7-80 SW% Blk L 
AOL--EN1 Exploration Co to 
EN1 Joint Venture 1979 et al 
11-17.80 Pt 18 A-4 
6 ROWs--to Michigan Wis-
consin Pipeline Co 
George R Lancaster et, al 
6-14-79 SW% 58 A-4 
Kenneth L Franklin 6-15-78 
SE% & SE% NE'/. 58 A-8 
Odessa Carwile et al 7-5-79 Pt 
Sec 99 A-5 
Olaf V Sivage et ux 6-25-79 Pt 
Sec 7 Blk H 
H B Taylor Jr et ux 12-28-78 
W1/2  Sec 4 A-2 
W A Goad Jr et ux 5-31-79 Pt 
E1/2  Sec 59 A-4 
C/C PROBATE--Robert G 
Nunn, Jr undated 
AFF -Gordon Stiles to Elise 
Stiles Walker 11-24-80 
D--Vernon L Carver et al to 
Robert G Robinson et ux 
10-10-80 Lots 17, 18, 19 Blk 1 
Shamrock 
DT--Robert G Robinson et ux 
to First Bk & Tr Shamrock 
11-25-80 Lots 17, 18, 19 Blk 1 
Shamrock 
D--O E Jackson et ux to Jessie 
Terry et ux 11-8-80 Lot 8 Blk 60 
Shamrock, WSSA 
A OF JUDG--Chaparral Elec 
Sup Co vs Beeny Reeves 
11-21-80 
FED TAX LIEN--Terry L Vick 
et ux to United States of 
America 11-26-80 
3 ASSIGN INCOME--David K 
Crockett et ux to United States 
of Amer 11-28-80 Land not set 
out 
DT--W V Lister et ux to 
Canadain Prod Cre Assn 
12-1-80 Pt Secs 59, 43, 60 all 62 
Blk 13, Lots in Benonine 
AFF--Hendy Lee Hamilton to 
mallie Lee Hamilton 11-21-80 
D--J M Liles et ux to J D 
Wallace et ux 11-19-80 Lots 11. 
12 BIk 10 Wheeler 
DECEMBER 2, 1980 
P OF ATTY--Oscar Pitman et 
ux to Greta Lee Thompson 
11-24-80 
MD--Marvin J Underwood et 
ux to P Darer\ Grimes et al 
12-1-80 6 ac int NW% 7 A-4 
2 MD--E T Davis et ux to E 
Turner Davis et al 12-1-80 2/8 
int Secs 43, 64. 53 Pt 47 Pt 42 
Blk A-7 
ROW--Eileen Moore Huyck et 
al to Colorado Interstate GAs 
Co 8-29-80 Pt SE' 3 Blk L 
DT--Keith Boydston et ux to 
First St Bk Mobeetie 11-28-80 
2.496 ac Sec 7 Blk RE 
DT--Tony Gonzales et ux to 
First Bk & Trust of Shamrock 
11-28-80 Pt Outlot 25 Sham-
rock 
2 PART D--Maureta Horn 
Croslin et al to Thurman Horn 
et al 11-26-80 Sec 4 Camp Co 
Sch Lnad; Pt Sec 4 Blk H; Pt 
SEP 49 SE% 23 Blk M-1; Pt 
Secs 56, 81 A-5 
D--L S Childress et ux to Gary 
Vise et al 11-27-80 W200ac S'A 
39 A-8 exc mins 
DT--Gary Vise et al to L S 
Childress et ux 11-27-80 W200 
ac 51/2  39 A-8 exc mins 

MK SALL: Melody Grand 
Piano, $500. Speed Queen 
Laundry. 	 4tc 

MD--Rosa McPherson Hen-
derson to James Ray McPher-
son Jr 11-18-80 1/7 int 325 ac 
EJD Grinolds Survey 
2 AOL--Wheeler Oil Co to Bem 
co 11-14-80 NE% 121 Blk 23; 
SE'/. 10 Blk 24 
MD--Panhandle P---ies Inc 

lieve to 0 B Burton be 	37.8 ac 
int Sec 29 Blk 0S2 
DECEMBER 3, 1980 
EXT MML--Carlos M Lopez et 
ux to First Bk & Tr Co Booker 
11-30-80 Pt Sec 4 T&oRyC 
ROY DIV ORDER--J Noel 
Sikes to Himself 11-24-80 Sec 
93 Blk 13 
2 OL--John Lee Beel et al to 
William L Arrington et al 
10-13-80 Sec 6 A-2 
2 D--Glenn Ray Henry et al to 
Doyle Jack Henry et al 
10.14-80 Pt Lots 6, 7 Blk 71 
Shamrock WSSA (u exc S25ft 
E50ft & 6 exc N10 ft) 
OL--Goldie Vee Calcote to 
Phillips Petroleum Co 8-18-80 
Lots 5, 6 Blk 46 Wheeler, 
Stanley Addn 
SUB--Fed Land Bk of Houston „j, 
to El Paso Nat Gas Co 11-7-80 
Land not set out 
4 RDT--Canadian Production 
Cre Assn to W V Lister et ux 
11-21-80 Pt 65 Blk 13, S1/2  17 & 
SE% 23 BIk L; NE'/. BIk L 
PARTIAL RDT--Federal Land 
Bk of Texas to James M 
Verden et ux 11-24-80 Pt NE'/. 
59 A-8 & SE% 12 Blk 24 
AFF--W Gordon Stiles et al to '-
Patricia Stiles Moderi Undated 
Sec 25 A-3 
DECEMBER 4, 1980 
A OF JUDG--Daniel Radiator 
Corp vs J D Clay et al 11.24-80 
OL--Mary Joyce Henderson to 
C M Fleetwood 10-28-80 SE'% 
& E1/2  NE% & E1/2  SW% 20 
A-5 
D--Jeane Hulsey to Millie -^ 
Jones Porter Estate 11-26-80 
30 ac Sec 82 Blk 17 
RDT--Mobil Oil Corp to J W 
Fields Oil co 6-18-80 Lots 1 to 
12 Blk H Lela Purcell Ad 
DT--J W Fields Oil Co to Mobil 
Oil Corp undated lots 1 to 12 
Blk H Leal Purcell Ad 
DT &MML--Ona Mae Weaver 
to Tom R Wilkins 12-4-80 Lot 
13 S4 ft 14 Moore Sub Div 
Wheeler 
RMML--Tom Wilkins to Hy-
land Weaver et ux 12-3-80 Lot 
13 S4ft 14 Moore Sub Div 
Wheeler 
D--Valdemar Johnny Velas-
quez et ux to Tom R Wilkins 
11-30-80 Lots 12, 13 More Sub 
Div Wheeler 
D--Valermar Johnny Velas-
quez to Ona Mae Weaver 
11-30-80 L 13 S4'14 Moore Sd 
Wheeler 
2 MD--Lyndon H Sims et ux 
to M Kent Sims et al 12-4-80 
120 ac int 35 A-4 exc 2 ac & 40 
ac int SE% Sec 46 A-4 
DECEMBER 5, 1980 
D--William David Stockstill Jr 
to Ken Randall Gill et ux 
11-20.80 1.3 int 497 ac Sec 30 1 
Blk 23 exc mins 
LIS 	PENDENS--Douglas 
Guthrie et ux vs Melvin Simp-
son et al 12-4-80 Pt Sec 60 B 23 
C/C PROBATE--Barbara H 
Smith 2-26-79 
AOL--M D Jaffe Jr to Tomothy 
O'Leary 11-20-80 SW% 4 Blk 
24; SE% 75 Blk 23 
8 RENTAL- DIV ORDERS--
Grady Rogers et al 8-21-80 
W123 ac & E700 ac sec 25 
camp Co Sch Ld 
ND--Velma Williams to John J 
Vtilliams et al 11-26-80 Sec 33 
Blk Re 
D--Edwin P Nall et ux to 
United Methodist Church 
11-13-80 L 7 to 14 Blk 8 Allison 
Exc Mins 
D--United Methodist Church 
to Edwin P Nall et ux 11.15-80 
Lots 5, 6 Allison, exc Mins 
RDT--Federal Land Bk of Tex-
as to Bobbie Lee Oswalt et al 
11-5-80 Land not set out 
DISTRICT CLERK'S OFFICE 
#7853 James E Campbell vs W 
J Estelle Jr 9-26-80 Writ of 
Habeas Corpus 
#7854 Daouglas Guthrie et ux 
to Melvin Simpson et ard  
11-26-80 Suit on Contract 

CARD OF THANKS 
Words are insufficient to 

thank each of you for the 
kindness and care shown to 
us during Tommie's illness 
and death. Your caring was 
a source of great joy to 
Tommie during his illness 
and sustains us now. There 
is no way we can ever repay 
you personally so our debt 
of gratitude to each of you 
will be passed on to some-
one else in their time of 
need. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 
Male or Female 

DEVELOPED INTO A 
BEAUTY! 

Tender loving care put into 
this 3 bedroom. 13/4 bath 
home at 406 Oklahoma. Call 
Shackelford, Inc. 806.665-6585 

rtn 

FOR SALE: 500 Comanche, a 
house that can be used for 2 or 
3 bedrooms, 1 bath, 31/2  lots. 
storage building. 826-3107, 
Connie Lambert. 	rtn 

Mark Woods 
Oil & Gas Properties 

• OIL & GAS LEASES 

• ROYALTIES 	• MINERALS 

PETROLEUM LAND MANAGEMENT 

SERVICES 

P.O. Box 542 	Wheeler, Tx 79096 

Office: (806) 826-5268 
Home: (806)826-5865 RUMMAGE SALE: Clothing 

10c to $1.00, Shoes 25c a pair. 
The Old Vogue Beaty Shop on 
Main Street, next door to 
Wheeler Rower Shop. 	4tp 

FOR SALE: 1974 Fleetwood 
Cadillac, good condition. 
826-3053. 	 rtn 

ALL TYPES OF 

CEMENT WORK 
Roofing of all types — Residential Additions 

Backhoe & Dirt Moving 

Metal Building Erection 

PETTY & ASSOCIATES 
General Contractors 

807 N. Wall 	 Shamrock, Texas 

Phone 256-2759 

FOR SALE: Gas cook stove. 
color TV, outside door, used 
carpet. Call 826-5818. 	2tp 

Callahan's 
Refrigeration FOR SALE: 1972 Chevrolet 

Blazer, good condition. Call 
375-2379 after 6:00 p.m. 	2tc Roy Callahan  

Heating — Air Conditioning 

Phone: 256-3141 

Shamrock, Texas 79079 

FOR SALE: 500 gal. butane 
tank, 40% full, 1 Catalina 
washing machine. 1 Wards 
washing machine, 1 Maytag 
wringer machine, 1 Wards 
Dryer. 375-2597. 	2tp 

4 
THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY FOR SALE: 1977 Cutlass 
Brougham, T-Top, AM-FM 
Stereo Tape, Power Windows, 
All extras, 20 mpg. 
256-3510 

louse Moving,; 
Call 
ltp SPARLIN'S-826-5898 

Wheeler, Texas 
mar  FOR SALE: AKC Toy Poodles. 

black or brown, $100, negoti- 
able. Phone: 806/256.3749 or 
405/534-2238. 	 3tp 

CARPENTRY WORK: Finish 
work and general repairs. 
Buck Hill, 826-5750. 	3tp 

TRAILER SPACE AVAIL- 
ABLE: 	Extra large lots. 
826-5634 or 826-3215. 	rtn 

DRILLING 
Commerci al 	Resi den ti al 

WELLS 
COMMERCIAL PUMP 

SALES & SERVICE 
CEPTIC TANK 

SOLD, SET & CLEANED 
BACKHOE WORK 

Banks Water Well Service 
& Drilling 

Mobeetie, Texas 
Phone: 845-3431 

r. 

' 

_tv:\h 4_\__0:1 r\i\\ 
1.1‘pitz 	

Yellow tom kitten with white 

Celest Wiley, 826-5273. 	ltc 
markings and white flea collar. 

FOUND 3-WEEKS AGO: 

0. 

P.O. Box 187 
Phone: 826-3123 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879, 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
Wheeler County. . . .$7.75 Outside County. .. .$8.75 

• 
PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 

Houses or Land 
Paul Topper 

200 S. Canadian St. 
806/826-5237 
Wheeler, Tx. 

Wheeler Lodge No. 1099 
A.F. & A.M. 

—Wayne Holt Plum ing 
Plumbing & Gas Heating MONDAY 

7:00 P.M. REPAIRS-REMODELING-NEW WORK 
Swer & Drain Service-Rotary Sewer Service Percy Farmer, Seey, 

Members Urged To Attend. 

Visitors Welcome. 

-LICENSED MASTER PLUMBER- 

Bonded — Insured 
806/826-5713 WHEELER 

REDI-MIX 
REDI-MIX CONCRETE 

SAND 

Washed Gravel—All Sizes 

Office Hours: 7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 
Ark 

Dr. Marion Roberts 

OPTOMETRIST 

P h one : 669-3333 

112 W. Kingsmill 

Pampa, Texas 

L MARY KAY 
COSMETICS 

For all of your needs 
Call Kay Luttrell 

806/375-2421 
Free Facials — Supplies — 

Deliveries 

Golden Glow 
Liquid Feed Supplement 

The Cattleman Feed Service Handles 
Only The Best, With The Best 

Possible Service. 
Up To 26% Natural Protein 

Sweet and Sour 
Best Consumption Control Known. 

Custom Mixed 
Plus Sun Glo Minerals 

Full Selection Plus Wheat Pasture 

TED NELSON 
806/826-5650 	 Wheeler, Texas 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES 
Swags, Cornices, Shutters 

—WE INSTALL FREE — 
Telephons: 256.3652 

Brannons Decorators 
Shamrock, Texas 79079 

Betty Hennard 
Angie Bernard 
Holly Hennard 
MIque, Jenks 

and Rebecca Allison 
Kathy Maddoax 

Bertha Henndard 
Marie Mallory 

IF YOU NEED CARPENTER 
WORK painting or any type of 
home construction, Call Bobby 
Sanderson, 779-2502 	4tc 

RATES 
CLASSIFIED RATES 

All classified ads must be 
paid in advance, except for 
open ledger account cus-
tomers. 

Charges are 13 cents per 
word. Minimum charge is 
$1.30. 

Card of Thanks charges 
will be $2.75. 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds: 5:00 p.m. Mon. 
Display: 	5:00 p.m. Mon. 

• 
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NUMB ARMS, LEGS 
Danger Signals 

There may be misalignment of vertebras in 
the spine causing pressure on nerves. yet the 
patient experiences no pain in the back. 
Instead. a variety of sensations may be felt 
in other parts of the body These include 
tingling, tightness. hot spots. cold spots. 
crawling sensations, electnc shock sensa-
tions. stinging, burning, and others. 

Here are nine critical symptoms involving 
back pain or strange sensations which are 
usually the forerunners of more senous con-
ditions Any one of these usually spells back 
trouble 

(I) Paresthesias (see above) (2) Headaches 
(3) Painful Joints oil Numbness in the arms 
or hands (5) Loss of sleep (6) Stiffness in the 
neck (7) Pain between the shoulders It) Stiff-
ness or pain in lower back (9) Numbness or 
pain in the legs. 

These signals indicate that your body is being robbed of 
normal nerve function Until this function is restored 
you will, in some degree. be incapacitated The longer 
you wait to seek help. the worse the condition will be-
come. Don't wait! Should you experience any of these 
danger signals . . call for in depth consultation in Lay-
man's terms. 

MaydOn a itOp taCtiC Clinic 
103 East 28th Street & Perryton Pky. 

PAMPA. TEXAS 79065 

TELEPHONE 806-665.7261 $6771* Sticker price Citation 4-dr. 

$6303 * Sticker price Fairmont 4-dr. 
comparably equipped 

$ 468 FAIRMONT ADVANTAGE 

Sticker pnce Chrysler K Car 4-dr. 

$6303* Sticker pnce Fairmont 4-dr. 
comparably equipped 

$ 535 FAIRMONT ADVANTAGE 

0127-pi) FORD 

Hayes from Borger. and her 
sister Fay Goodson from Stin-
nett. 

Evelyn is still with Jay 
Michael. 

Tom and Alice Bell Helton 
ate Thanksgiving dinner with 
Thomas Roy and Martha Hel-
ton in Wheeler. Others there 

1980 

we enjoyed a very delicious 
meal and played 88 after-
wards. 

Colie went to Perryton Fri-.  
day with J. 0. Helton to his 
brother. Charley Helton sale. 

Thanksgiving visitors 	at 
Harold and Lessie Austins 
besides Kenneth were Grace 
Martin, Harolds aunt 	and 
Capolia Wilson (now isn't that 
an odd and pretty name. 

Lessie Austin shopped in 
Pampa Thursday. 

Elbert and Ruby Zybach ate 

night, so their mother and 
grandmother could go shop-
ping Jimmy came out that 
nite. 

Cloid and Teresa and Amber 
was visiting Thursday night 
also. 

Saturday Helen is looking 
for her brother Joe and Nell 

dinner Thanksgiving day at 
Bob and Gena Zybachs, others 
there were Curtis and Jane 
Ann Hall and Kent, Kyndell 
Murray, David and Beckie 
Zybach. Christy and Shawn. 
Bevard and Mary, 	Diane 
Dukes, Deidre and Andrea, 
Wayne and Kathy Zybach, 
Steve Zybach, Ruby said all 
her kids and grand kids were 
there but Kathy Murray she 
had to work, hope I have all 
down. 

Tuesday Ruby's brother, 
Everett and Iris Goad of 
Pampa visited them. 

Essie and Donald Finster-
wald also visited Elbert and 
Ruby Tuesday. 

Kelley Walker and her mot-
her, Margarette Stiman from 
Ruidoso visited Cliff 	and 
Dorothy Walker Friday after-
noon. 

For Thanksgiving Cliff and 
Dorothy Walker, Jim and 
Kelley Walker and Waylon 
and Jamie went to Wildorado 
to visit Bill Walker and family. 

Thanksgiving day at Helen 
Heltons were Jimmy an Joann 
Helton, Tammy and Todd and 
Jason, Mark and Annette 
Meek and Kaleb, Saundra 
Meek, Cloid and Teresa Hel-
ton and Amber came for 
supper. 

Helen said Jay Michael 
Meek called Annette and talk-
ed to her Yesterday and he 
was improving real good. 
looked forward to getting out 
of the hospital soon. Now that 
sounds real good. 

Tuesday Lee and Jo Ann 
White came to visit Helen and 
they were on little vacation 
they stayed till Thursday. 

Thursday night Tammy and 
Todd and Jason spent the 
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Ken Doughtry, County Fire Marshal 

 

Mary's sister (then on to 
Lamar, Colo came home yes-
terday 4th. 

Dec 4 , we had a big frost 
Dec. 5 another big fog and 
dew everything very wet. 

Colie and I ate supper last 
night with James and Bea 
Ogle and girls, others there 
were Claude and Mable Parker 

were Dan and Toni Helton and 
Zack from McLean, Forace 
and Nita Evans. Terry and 
Gayle Lewallen and girls. 
Karen Helton, and Randy 
Cooner of Amarillo. 

Saturday Bill and Phillis 
Helton and Jeff spent the 
night with Tom and Alice Bell. 

Virgil and Mae Helton visit-
ed them Sunday afternoon. 

Tuesday Tolbel ieve  lice Bell 
visited Gene and Marie Cud-
gel in Mobeetie. 

Wednesday they were in Elk 
City and Sayre. They ate 
dinner with Joe Paul and Joyce 
Smith. 

Tuesday night they and 
Thomas Roy and Martha went 
to Shondas Christmas program 
at Kelton. 

Friday night Alice Bell and 
Pauline were host to a going 
away or retiring party for Mrs. 
Roark, her Sunday school class 
was there also. 

Last Monday Gena Zybach  • 
took her daddy and mother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Reid to 
Pampa shopping to celebrate 
her mother's birthday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 
Hunt, two members on Bob 
and Gena Tour in 1976, Mn. 
Hunt called today to wish Bob 
and Gena and Steve a Merry 
Christmas and Happy New 
Year from Hartford, Iowa. 

Mark Meek, Dean Tipps, 
Vern Lohburger were some 
more that attended Charlie 
Heltons Farm sale Friday. 

Mac and Gaye Purcell and 
children ate supper with her 
parents, R. L. and Rozena 
Zybach, others there were 
Clarence and Irene Zybach, 
Shane and Travis Goad Friday 
nite. 

Saturday visitors 	at our 
house were Alene Hall, Jerry 
and Jay J. Hall. 

Trent and Stuart Young of 
Amarillo ate supper Saturday 
with us. They said Arland 
Young had knee surgery and 
will have to have another one. 

It started raining Saturday 
night this is Sunday night it is 
still raining, has rained off and 
on all day. 

Jimmy Joe and Sandy Ault 
shopped in Amarillo Wednes-
day. They attened Keith and 
Margarette Ann Boydston 
house warming Sunday after-
noon. 

James and Bea Ogle and 
girls visited Claude and Mable 
Parker Saturday. 

Claude and Mable attended 
her grand daughters Keith and 
Margarette Ann house warm-
ing Sunday afternoon. This 
afternoon was pretty dis-
agreeable for their party. 

A wind and rain cloud hit 
the J.O. Heltons and Claude 
and Mable Parkers houses 
they said it really blew hard, 
Sam Ault said it blew their 
screen door off. They all 
thought it was going to blow 
them away. Jimmy Joe wanted 
to know if I heard any toronado 
news. I listened to a cloud go 
north of us, one was south, we 
didn't get that kind of wind, 
we were in between. 

21 degrees this morning, 
Monday 8th, December for 
ones away temperatue going 
down. 

Willis and Verna Fillingim 
had received 2 inches of rain. 

R. H. and Bettie Dyson 
spent Wednesday with Roy 
and Lois Meadows. 

The Eddie Sumpter family 
made a quick trip to Dallas last 
Monday night to visit Har-
riette's mother ill in hospital. 

A nice shower for Johnny 
and Tarita Sutton Saturday, 
hostesses were Willa Fill-
ingim, Martha Meek, Phillis 
Hefley, Phoebe Hartline, Rita 
Fillingim, LaJo Crownover, 
Tola Fay Meek, Lois Mea-
dows, Verna Fillingim, Sue 
Ratcliff and Evelyn Meek. 

Willis and Verna ate supper 
Saturday night in Don Cornett 
home south of Canadian. 

Gene and Roberta Signs. 
and Darrell and Melodee Rod-
enberg went to a Kansas and 
Nebraska supper Friday 
night in Pampa. 

Dustin and Darren spent 
Friday night with Willis and 
Verna, Shannon spent 'the 
night with Marcie Roberts. 

Darrell Rodenberg family 
shopped in Amarillo Saturday. 

Willis and Verna attended 
the house warming at Keith 
and Margarette Boydstons 
Sunday afternoon. 

Verna said everything was 
so beautiful in Keith and 
Margarette Ann house. 

Mary Bruntmeyer and Willa 
Fillingim shopped in Pampa 
Tuesday. 

David and Winnie Gilmer 
and children shopped with 
Daryl and Tillie Snelgrooes in 
Pampa Saturday. 

Sunday the Daryl Snel-
grooes visited the David Gil-
mers. 
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NO GIFTS PLEASE 

SHUGART COUPON 
Mon., December 15 

t 
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Loyd's & Street's 

13.EN FRANKLIN 

40° S. Main 9  
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS 

Vetola Parker 
Dec. 1, a lot of my news will 

not interest people aroundhere 
but the ones away really enjoy 
it, (like the T.V. says). My 
news is like the T.V. if you 
don't like to read it turn the 
page. 

Friday, December 5, Essie 
Finsterwald was looking for 
the Don Pattersons from 
Carlsbad, N.M. this weekend. 

Essie and boys had John 
and Marie Wright, David and 
Ann and Karl Moreland from 
High Plains Children Home in 
Amarillo last weekend. 

John Wright took Essie to 
Pampa Tuesday to the eye 
doctor. 

Tola Fay Meet was acting as 
Santa Claus Thursday. She 
and the 4-H'ers fixed Essie a 
box of goodies for Christmas 
gift. 

Friday before Thanksgiving 
Addie Swift went with Dub 
and Mary Swift to Garden 
City, Kansas to visit Albert 
Sporn family. On Sunday 
Addie and Mary went on to 
Serysue, Kansas to visit 

t  P222 
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*8 x 10; 
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Extra charge 

for 
GROUPS 

BALANCED NUTRITION 

of lights per single extension. 
Read munufacturer's instruct-
ions carefully and do not use 
more than the recommended 
number of lights in 	one 
circuit. 

Always turn off lights on 
trees and other decorations 
when you retire or leave your 
home. A short circuit in any of 
this equipment could cause a 
fire. 

Never use electric lights on 
a metallic tree. 	Damaged 
insulation in lighting on a 
metallic tree could cause the 
entire tree to be charged with 
electricity. To avoid this 
danger, use colored spotlights 
above or beside a metal tree, 
never fastened onto it. 

Keep children away from 
light sets and electrical decor-
ations. All lights present the 
problem of shock and casualty 
haszards for kids. 

PAPER 
The opening of Christmas 

presents is always a special 
time during the holidays. 
Take special precautions when 
disposing of the wrappings. 

Always dispose of wrap-
pings immediately after open-
ing. 

Place trash in a metal con-
tainer. DON'T burn wrapp-
ings in the fireplace, they may 
ignite suddenly, and cause a 
flash fire. 

TREES 
Artificial trees (plastic) sho-

uld bear the UL Label. Some 
unlabeled plastic trees burn 
with extreme vigor. 

Do not rely on chemical 
coatings or sprays to make 
your liveebergreen flame-res-
istant. Follow the safety rules 
below when shopping for a 
natural tree. 

A fresh tree will stay green 
longer and be less of a fire 
hazard than a dry tree. To 
check for freshness, Remem-
ber: 

Check for color and scent. A 
fresh tree is deep green in 
color and has a strong scent of 
pine. Be sure that the needles 
do not readily fall from the 
tree. The trunk butt of a fresh 
tree should be sticky with sap. 
Place your Christmas tree in a 
location away from fireplaces, 
radiators, or other heat sour-
ces. Be sure that it is out of 
the traffic pattern and does not 
block doorways. 

Cut off about 2-inches of the 
trunk. Mount tree in a sturdy 
waterholding stand with wide-
spread legs. Be sure that the 
tree is stable. 

Fill base holder with water. 
Keep it full of water while the 
tree is indoors (as you would 
fresh flowers). Remember, 
heated rooms dry trees out 
rapidly; and a dry tree is a fire 
hazard. 

FIRES 
Your fireplace is a source of 

warmth and heat. 	Before 
starting your fire, be sure to 
remove all paper decorations 
and boughs from immediate 
area. Be sure the flue is open. 
Never set up your Christmas 
tree near the fireplace, this is a 
potential fire hazard. 

Use a screen to inclose the 
front of your fireplace to 
confine live embers and sparks 
to the fire box. 

CANDLES 
Never use lighted candles 

on a tree or near other 
evergreens. Always use 
non-flammable holders. Keep 
away from other decorations, 
wrapping paper. Place candl-
es where they cannot be 
knocked down or blown over. 

TRIMMINGS 
The trimiing of your Christ-

mas tree is a very important 
part of your holiday festivities. 
Keep the safety of your family 
in mind when selecting trim- 

FREE CHOICE 
• V ENERGY 
	

V MINERALS 

✓ PROTEIN 
	

V VITAMINS 
• 

Keep The Ho (ho-ho) In The 
Holiday Season 

Fire losses during the holi-
day season are especially he- 
artrending. 	Most of the 
residential fires that occur 
during the holidays are pre-
ventable. Please keep the 
following safety tips in mind 
when you are making preper-
ations for the holidays. 

LIGHTS 
Christmas lights and 

other decorations set the the-
me for the Christmas holidays. 
Here are some very important 
points to remember when us-
ing them. 

Use only lights that have 
been tested for safety. Ident-
ify these by the UL Label from 
Underwriters Laboratories. 

Check each set of lights for 
broken or cracked sockets, 
frayed. or bare wires, loose 
connections. Discard any of 
this equipment that you deem 
unsafe. 

Check labels of lights to be 
used outdoors to see that they 
are suitable for outdoor use. 
Never use indoor lights out-
side. Fasten outdoor lights 
securely to trees, walls, or 
other firm support to protect 
them from wind damage. 

Use no more than three sets 

4 
• 

4 ,  WITH THE PERFECT 
CHRISTMAS GIFT 

14. 	§ 
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irr jr. 

Zenth 

or RCA 

Zenth 

or Sony 

Car Stereo 	Radio's c?.. Speakers 

Amplifiers & Power Boosters 

Stereos 
Televisions t".".*:: • — 	tt 74%.-77 41titastr• 	. Al 

BALANCED nutrition is easy with the FSC 4 or 5 Point Program .. and the proper 

balance between all the minerals, vitamins, energy and protein is the most 

important part of beef cattle production 	. FREE CHOICE feeding of MOREA* 
Energized Protein Supplement. MORANOL® Energized Supplement and 
CATALYX® Minerals and Vitamins provides the balance you are looking for . 
THIS PROGRAM WORKS . . Write today for free information. 

5-POINT FEED CO. 
— 11 2 Miles South of Wheeler — 

PHONE: 806 '826-5897 

MOREA. MORANOL, and CATALYX are registered trade marks of Feed Service Corporation 

Tapes & Records 
Tape Players 

Seminers 
Telephones 

L and F 
REPAIR 110 W. Oklahoma 

Phone: 826-3241 

THE FAIRMONT 
ADVANTAGE. 

IT MAKES A WORLD OF SENSE 
...AND DOLLARS. 

$6303* 
"Th BEAUTIFULLY 

EQUIPPED: 
AM radio (may be 

deleted for credit) 
Front power disc brakes 
Rocker panel molding 
Bodyside molding 
Window frames 
Steel-belted WSW tires 
Deluxe wheel covers 
Deluxe seat belts 
Rub strips (front & rear) 

FAIRMONT 4-DOOR HAS HIGHER EPA ESTIMATED MPG THAN 
CHEVY CITATION, MORE ROOM THAN CHRYSLER'S K CAR 4-DOOR 

SEDAN AND A STICKER PRICE HUNDREDS LESS THAN EITHEle* 
MORE LUGGAGE AND TOTAL ROOM 
THAN X AND K 4-DOOR SEDANS. 
Fairmont is simply more car than either of its higher 
priced 4-door competitors, according to the 1981 EPA 
intenor volume index. 

0 
HIGHER EPA EST. MPG THAN ANY STANDARD 
GM X CAR.Fairmont beats both X car sedans and 

wagons in est. mpg, based on a comparison 
of models with 4-cylinder engine and manual 
transmission. For comparison. your mileage 
may differ depending on speed. distance 

EPA EST MPG and weather. 

MORE ROOM AND GREAT VALUE IN 
WAGONS, TOO. 
No K wagon or X hatchback matches the cargo room of 
the Fairmont wagon. according to the 1981 EPA intenor 
volume index. 

COMPARE! 

BAKE SALE 
December 13, 1980 

Thriftway 
YHT will take your orders. 
Call before December 10, 

	826-5635 
826-3269 

Proceeds: 	826-3053 
FIRE DEPARTMENT and 
MARCH OF DIMES 

''Companson based on models elm a 4.speed manual transmeasion 

• koanutdcLge, s s,ggestesi 'era 	e Tile Mies and destination charges extra 

11 FORD FAIRMONT. 
IT MAKES AWORLD OF SENSE. 

Pete Burton Ford 
Wheeler, Texas Continued Page 6 
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WELCOME TO 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

8T1-4 AT MAIN - P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

Church (606) 826.3110 - Parsonage 1806) 826.3079 

Ernie 
McGaughey 

Pastor 

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship 

U-U Electrical Service 
"We handle all your electrical needs'' 

RESIDENTIAL, COMMERCIAL and CUSTOM 

Robert and Laura Underwood, Owners 

Box 269 
	

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Call Day or Night: 826-3150 

If no answer — 845-2442 

LEWALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

THE FITTIN'EST 
PULL-ON WORK BOOTS 

FIT FOR YOUR FEET 

AND FIT FOR YOUR JOB! 

SIZES 
AAAAAA BCD E EE EEE 

10 14 9.15 8-15 7-16 7.14 4-16 5'/7.15 614 714 

1 155 
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B.J.'s WEARHOUSE 
4W South Main 	 Wheeler, Texort 

Whifjp991 

P3 
500 

; 	Your  
GIVE THIS WHIRLPOOL 

LARGE CAPACITY 
WASHER 

	.,Ahrt 

	

 	PLEASE YOUR FAMILY WITH im 
alyt ttb45°P, 	 THE GIFT THAT KEEPS ON 

GIVING 

19.5 Cu. Ft. No- 
Frost Refrigerator 

wit $658 
$378 

-Whirlpool 
E 	APP AN E 

Adluslable tempered glass shelves that 
help prevent spills from dripping 
through. 19.5 11. total refrigerated 
volume including 5.85 cu ft freezer 
compartment. Durable porcelain-on• 
steel interior resists rust. stains. 
scratches LARGE CAPACITY WASHER that 

washes up to 18 lbs of heavy denims 
and twill garments 4 automatic 
cycles, double duty super surgllator 

agitator to help you get your family's 

clothes cleaner and brighter. Water 

saving load size selector .  
a 

• 
a 

12.0 CU. FT. 
UPRIGHT FREEZER 

ISMIEN11‘ $348 

Power saving heater control switch Super 
storage door shelves Convenient defrost 
Grain. Teitured steel doors to help hide 
fingerprints, scratches 

EEV12IF 

RJM 7500 Whirlpool .., S 

Prepare Your Holiday 
Feast With This 
Whirlpool Microwave 

WHILE THEY LAST! 
esealellia 

EEV124F 

GIVE 
UNDER 

COUNTER 
OR 

PORTABLE 
DISH- 

WASHERS 
FROM 

WHIRLPOOL 
Your Choice 

$368 
Cook by time, Cook by temperature 
Top quality microwave that features 
Balanced Wave Cooking the system 
that provides the best all-around 
cooking performance A digital MEAL 
TIMER control provides up to 60 
minutes continuous cooking or 
defrosting lime MEAL SENSOR 
PROBE lets you cook foods to 
doneness yOu prefer it has quality 
bull! in as you expect from Whirlpool 

5 Cycle Convertible/ 
Portable Dishwasher 

Undercounter Dishwashers 
with 4 Auto Cycles $3 78 00 
$368 $368 

Super scour. Super wash. rinse hold and 
energy saving 2 full size revolving spray 
arms with Miner column for more 
thorough washing action 

Cycles Include super scour. super wash. 
china 'crystal. rinse, hold and short 2 full elle 
revolving spray arms Solid wood reversible 
worktop 

• • 

• L E 	Phone: 826-5532 

Hardware & Furniture 
Wheeler, Texas 

EET2012K 

LHA 
7680 
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TERRACES 
about it, come by the Soil 
Conservation Service office 
and the techinicians will be 
glad to work with you to 
eleminate these problems. 

When the early settlers of 
this great nation first came to 
this part of the country most of 
them were not very concerned 
about taking care of their land. 

saving the valuable top soil. If 
all the inconveniences of 
terraces and all the benefits 
are carefully considered, sure-
ly the decision for a good 
terrace system will be made. 

If you have an erosion 
problem on your farm and 
would like to do something 

The average dollar bill in 
circulation will last about 
18 months. 

ILhacs  
HOBBY KORRAL 

100 THOMAS LANE 

SNOWMAN: With school 
closing early Tuesday after-
noon the young people had a 
little extra time in the after-
noon and went to work build-
ing a snowman on the court-
house square. An estimated 
four inches of snow fell Nov. 

25 and produced 0.55 inches 
of moisture. 	Pictured are 
(standing, L. to R.) Chandra 
Crockett, Scott Wright, Tracy 
Weaver, Becky Crockett and -
(seated), Ruth Ann Alexander,( 
Mona Jennings. and Jamie 
Porter. 

Dr. Willis Harrison of Can-
yon was over nite guest in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Harrison. 

Winnie's sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Glen George of Wheeler and 
Mrs. Voncille Kirkpatrick of 
Belle Fourche, South Dakota 
were Saturday dinner guest of 
Winnie and Lee Kiker. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Kiker 
were in Pampa 	shopping 
Monday. 

The Allison United Metho-
dist Church are to have their 
Christmas Party Wednesday. 

Dennis and Jeannette Hulse 
and daughter of Amarillo, Pam 
and Rick Hickernell, Melissa, 
Melody and Jonathan Walker 
of Allison and Jennifer and 
Stephenie Walker of Wheeler 
wer Sunday dinner guest of 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Walker. 
Clifton and Louise Boydston 

celebrated their 30th Wedding 
Anniversary in Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma Friday. They also 
did some shopping. 

Cheryl and Kim Boydston 
spent Friday nite with Jerry 
and Sue Montgomery 	of 
Crawford. 

Keith and Ann Boydston 
had a real good turn out for 
their housewarming. many 
came out, although the weat- 
her was rainy and bad. Their 
house is beautiful inside and 
out. It real nice. They got 
many nice gifts. I heard that 
there was around seventy 
eight that came. 

Only 
one week left to 

finish your ceramics Dr. M. V. Cobb 
CHIROPRACTOR 
Specializing in The 

Examination 4nd 
Treatment of Spinal 

4nd Nervous Disorders 

256-2133 

310 —South :damn 
SHAMROCK, TEXAS 

Postmaster's 
Plea: Mail Early 

If the soil they were tilling got 
to the point where it would not 
produce, they simple moved 
on to another part of the 
country and broke out more 
land. It is not possible to do 
this any more. In fact the 
leaders of our nation tell us 
that we will have to feed and 
cloth many more people in the 
near future and this will have 
to be done on less acreage. 
This of course is due to the 
"population explosion" of the 
world. With this in mind we 
need to ask ourselves if we are 
using our soil in a way to 
preserve and improve it. 

Much of our soil in the 
Wheeler County Soil Conser-
vation District needs to be 
terraced in order to preserve it 
so it will produce good crops in 
the years to come. Many times 
we hear landowners make a 
remark such as: "My farm 
should have been terraced 
years ago, but I hate to work 
them so bad that I just would 
not build them." It is true that 
a field that is terraced is 
harder to work than a good 
level field with no terraces. 
However, much of our culti-
vated land is rolling and if it is 
not terraced, soon there will be 
gullies through our fields that 
we cannot cross with our 
modern farm equipment. This 
is much more of a nusiance 
than the terraces. 

A good terrace system on 
our farm will keep it from 
washing into gullies as well as 
stop the sheet erosion. Also, 
terraces will help to conserve 
the moisture, as well as distri-
bute it over the land more 
evenly. Here in Wheeler Co-
unty this is one of the great 
assets of a terrace system, 
because we have periods of 
drouth quite frequently. Some 
farmers report that terraces 
have increased their yield up 
to one third more than it was 
before terracing. 	This of 
course is due to the better 
moisture conditions as well as 

'I will be closed Decemberss1 
20 thru January 5." 

Phone: 826-5792 

$&7 

With the Christmas mail 
load now hitting its peak, the, 
Postmaster today expressed 
his appreciation for the fine 
cooperation on the "Shop and 
Mail Early for Christmas" 
campaign. "Time means eve-
rything now," he said. He 
warns that only by stepping up 
all Christmas card and gift 
package mails immediately 
will it be possible to process.  
and deliver all cards and. 
packages by Christmas Day. 
He urged the use of ZIP Codes 
on all mail. 

The Postal Service faces a 
critical situation during the 
next few days. Every postal 
employee is digging in for the 
final big rush. The urge that 
mailing Christmas cards and 
packages be done now. A.  
delay of a few hours may mean 
they cannot arrive at their 
destination before Christmas. 
Make this the merriest Chri-
stmas yet by "Mailing Early 
and Often." 

84 5-2951 

By Juanita Boydston 
Wowl This icy weather sure 

makes you want to stay around 
the fire and keep warm. I don't 
think the weather knows what 
to do. We had a thunder storm 
yesterday and sleet today. 1 
thought it odd to have it 
thundering and lighting here 
in December. 

Terry Ockerman of Amarillo 
was guest in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. W. H. Boydston and A  
Juanita Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Sims of 
Chino, California are spending 
a week with his sister, Susie 
Lohberger. 

Mr. and Mrs. Verne Loh-
berger attended the 50th 
Wedding Anniversary of Mr. 
and Mrs. Aubrey Duff of 
Pampa Sunday. 

Friday, Rev. and Mrs Ron-
nie Chadwick and Rhonda, 
Miranda and Carra journeyed 
to Altus and visited. Ruth. 
Rhonda and girls went on to 
Davidson and attended the 
Davidson Homecoming. They 
met Joe and Pattie Hughes 
back in Altus. 

Bobby and Mary Cornell 
and Joe and Beverly Smith of 
Miami, Texas, Mr. Lloyd 
Hammon and son of Cheyenne 
Oklahoma, and his friend and 
son were Sunday dinner guest 
of Mrs. Gertie Cornell. 

Allen and Vickie Donaldson 
of Canyon and Jimmy. Dawn 
and Darla and Daniel Lewis 
were Sunday dinner guest of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Donaldson. 

Dan Jr. Bowmen of Level-
and spent this week with his 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Elmore. 

Hershal Sanford visited a 
few days with Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Harrison while working 
here some. 

Hershal Sanford visited a 
few days with Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Harrison while working 
here some. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Harri-
son were in Canyon on busi-
ness last week. 

Janice, Neal and SaRita and 
Juanita were in Pampa on 
business and did some shop-
ping. 

ALL-LINES pi 

vOUM 
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8 26-5 719 
114 TE XAS ST 

WHEELER , Tx 

1ST STATE BR BLDG. 

MOSIETIE,TEX. 

mings, and decorating your 
tree. 

When choosing the finishing 
touches for the tree, purchase 
tinsel or artificial icicles of a 
non-leaded material. Leaded 
materials may be if eaten by 
children or pets. 

If youngsters are a part of 
your family, take special care 
to: Avoid any decorations that 
tend to break easily, or have 
sharp edges. 	Keep tree 
trimmings that are small, or 
have removable parts, out of 
the reach of your child. These 
pieces may be swallowed. 

Don't purchase ornaments 
that resemble candy or foods. 
A small child may try to eat 
them. 

THE 

SHIRT SHACK 
114 East Texas Street 

Letters  & Transfers 
Jersy & T-Shirts 

Sherri Lewallen 
Phone: 426-571? 

it 

let us smoke 
This year, 

your 

CHRISTMAS 

TURKEY 
or HAM 

DEADLINE: DECEMBER 23, 1980 

Phone: 826-3156 
Lii' Rustler 

RESTAURANT 
404 1/2  S. Main — Wheeiee- 
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PARKLANE 
ESTATES 

• 12 LOTS AVAILABLE ON PAVING 

• 2 HOUSES UNDER CONSTRUCTION 

— 95° FINANCING AVAILABLE — 

Realty tit Southwest 
115 West Texas Street 

Wheeler, Texas 

Phone: 806:826-5202 or 826-3283 
Baby opossums multiply 
their birth weight ten times 
in the first week of life. 
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husband had moved here, but 
I just had not made the 
opportunity to get acquainted. 
These people, who I think will 
be quite an asset to our 
community are, Peggy and 
Delmar Wood. They moved 
here from Oklahoma and live 
on Main Street, in the house 
that their son Charles and 
family have just 	vacated. 
Charles has bought the house 
that we commonly refer to as 
"the Nicholson house," which 
has recently been owned by 
Robert Roark, The Woods 
have remodeled and bricked 
the house. It is very attractive 
on the outside, and I am sure it 
is the same on the inside. The 
remodeling isn't quite finish-
ed, but "settling in" is hoped 
for by Christmas or New Year. 

Antoher new person 	in 
town, which I have neglected 
to mention is Buster Reedy 
who is operating the Boot and 
Saddle Shop. He is an aimable 
young man, who promises to 
be "worth having around." 
Employed in the store is 

S Sheriff's Association Membership „AIere El 5h ere 
elate Membership Program Sheriff Doyle Ramsey has 

announced that the Sheriffs' 
Association of Texas' Asso- 

re-
of 

."I would like to thank each 
Associate Member for aiding 
in the struggle to profes-
sionalize sheriffs' departments 
statewide," the sheriff said. 

Sheriff Ramsey said that the 
Sheriffs' Association of Texas 
is still accepting Associate 
Members, and anyone who did 
not receive an believe t iob  by  

mail should contact his office. 
Memberships can also be ob-
tained by sending your name, 
address, and check-520.00 
for an individual membership 
to Sheriffs' Association of 
Texas. P.O. box 4488, Austin, 
Texas 78765. 

All new members will re-
ceive a membership card, two 

and a 
to the 
of the 

Laura Guthrie 
You know Christmas is al-

mast here when the Holiday 
greetings begin to appear in 
the mail box. And what a good 
feeling that is—some body has 
you on their mind. How grate-
ful we are. 

1'1 

	

	Last week I met a woman 
who has not been in our town 
long. I knew she, and her 

Postmaster Asks 
Write Clearly 

One of the biggest problems 
postal employees face is ille-
gible handwriting. "At Chri-
stmas time, when mail volum-
es skyrocket, this can become 
a major problem," the post-
master said today. 

"The use of ZIP Codes by 
mailers does help speed up the 
process because often if the 
city and state are unreadable. 
the ZIP Code will direct the 
mail to the post office from 
which it will be delivered. 
Clerks in that post office, 
being more familiar with local 
residents, may be able to 
figure out the person to whom 
the mail should be delivered." 

Another significant problem 
is the number of parcels 
delayed or actually undeliver-

0 ed because of poor wrapping 
or packing. The Postmaster 
urged that special care be 
taken to see that each package 
is tightly stuffed and that 
nothing rattles around inside. 

Parcels are generally ship-
ped in bags, and often heavier 
items rest on top of smaller, 
lighter packages. The Post-
master encouraged mailers to 
be a bit cautious and insure all 
packages. 

All parcels should be add- 
ressed on only one side, and 
should have the address writ-
ten somewhere on the inside of 
the package in case the exter-
ior wrapping should come off. 
It is a good idea to also enclose 
a list of the contents. 

Poor packaging and illegible 
or incorrect addressing acc-
ount for about half a million 
undelivered parcels each year. 

:a  
windshield decals, 
year's subscription 
quarterly magazine 
Sheriffs' Association of Texas. 

SIGNS, SUTTON VOWS 
EXCHANGED NOV. 21 

mother of the groom playing 
the organ. 

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a peach 
colored dress trimed in beige 
lace with beige heels. The 
bridesmaid was Lily Sumpter 
of Briscoe. She wore an orange 
dress and matching heels. 

Jimmy Ryan of Sheppard air 
Force Base in Witchita Falls, 
was the bestman. He wore his 
dress uniform. 

Cake and punch were served 
following the ceremony. 

The couple are now residing 
in Briscoe where the groom is 
employed with Kansas Ne-
braska. 

10 
Senior Citizens 
Dec. 1 Meeting 

mail it so that the "Times" 
will receive it by December 
12th. 

Address it this way: 
Santa Letters 

The Wheeler Times 
Box 1080 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Santa 	From Page 

CARD OF THANKS 
Dear Friends with an 

humble heart, I want to 
thank each one for, cards, 
prayers, flowers, telephone 
calls and visits while I was 
confined to Highland Gen-
eral Hospital, also thanks to 
so many dear friends for 
invitations to eat Thanks-
giving dinner with them in 
their homes. 

May God Bless you. 
Nolya Westmoreland 

CARD OF THANKS 
During the illness and death 

of our husband and dad, 
James T. Guinn Jr., my child-
ren and I would like to take 
this opportunity to thank all 
our friends and neighbors for 
the prayers, food, flowers and 
just being our friends. also to 
Brother Jerry and Linda, who 
was such a help and blessing. 

Sincerely, 
Mona Guinn 

Stanley Baker Family 
Cherry A. Body family 

John Paul Guinn & Shell! 
David & Debbie Guinn 

CARD OF THANKS 
No words can begin to 

express our appreciation to 
all you friends and neigh-
bors. At this time of our loss 
it it comforting to know that 
Mother was loved by so 
many of you, too 

It is unfortunate 	that 
something like this must 
happen before you truly 
understand the meaning of 
the word "friend". 

We thank you again for 
all the many kind deeds. 

Bless you all, 
The Betty Davis family 

Ray 
Third Grade; "B" Amanda 
Traeger 
Fourth Grade; "B" Sam, Bo-
mar, Brett Buckingham, Karla 
Harris, Sue Ann Jones, Andy 
Singleton 
Fifth Grade; "A"; Julie Moore 
"B" Melinda Davidson, Scotty 
Ellis, Paige Penny. 
Sixth! Grade; "B" Michele 
Keelin, Martha Taylor 
Seventh Grade; "A"; Lacy 
Buckingham, Teresa Moore 
Eight Grade; "B"; Kern Cle-
mens. Russell Holster. Dusty 
Bomar 

First Grade; "A"; Brandy 
Spence, Heather Honeycutt, 
Keeli Clemens 
"B"; Shonda Lewallen, Neal 
Ray Davis 
Second Grade; "A"; Bobby 
Buckingham, Kevin Davis, 
Noel Johnson 

B 1 1;  

Kelton School 
Honor Roll 

Susan Davidson, Lori 

Y.H.T. Meeting 
November 1 7 

November 17 was the 
Wheeler Chapter of Young 
Homemakers regular monthly 
meeting held at 7:00 in the 
Homemaking Department of 
Wheeler High School. Busi-
ness was first on the agenda. 
A Bake Sale was Discussed 
and the date was set for 
December 13. Proceeds from 
the baked goods will go to the 
Wheeler Fire Department and 
March of Dimes, half and half. 
A progressive dinner for the 

husbands was planned for 
December 20. Members pre-
sent were Wendy Cole. Cathy 
Harrison, Lois Puryear, Debra 
Glazner, Dolores Simmons, 
Deliese Johnson, and Lynn 
Francis. Guests present were 
Cindy Stewart, Lucretia Davis, 
and Pat Dunkle. We were very 
glad to have these guests and 
we hope they will want to come 
again. 

Jim Wright from Wheeler 
Flower Shop gave the program 
for the evening. Mr. Wright 
showed us how to arrange cut 
flower bouquets. Two beauti-
ful arrangements were made 
and interesting tips and rules- 
to-go-by were given. 	Jim 
explained the basic technique-
es for making arrangements. 
The cost was discussed and 
was more understandable aft- 
er the explanation how to be 
economical with out the loss of 
beauty. Y.H.T. enjoyed the 
program immensily. Also, Jim 
left the arrangements to be 
drawn for door prizes. The 
lucky winners were Debra 
Glazner and Lynn Francis. 

Personal 
Those spending the 

Thanksgiving holidays with 
Mr. and Mrs. Guy Brown were 
their four boys, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Brown and Jessica 
Lyn of Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Brown, Danny and 
Amber of Lefors; 	Donald 
(Duck) Brown of White Deer 
and Joe Brown and Mysea 
Copeland both of Pampa. 

They all attended 	the 
funeral Wednesday of Guy's 
nephew, Johnny Fish at 
Allison. He is the son of Sibyl 
Fish of Dumas. 
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Debbie Sandlin. She recently 
moved here from Magic City. 
She and her children live on 
Osage Street. 

George "Punk" Martin and 

Wed. Study Club 
Meets Dec. 4 

After unscheduled delays 
the Wednesday Study Club 
met December 4, with Laura 
Guthrie as hostess. The group 
was called to order by the 
President, Mrs. David Britt 
and business was discharged 
as presented. The president 
presented future plans and 
opportunities for acitivities in 
the General Federation of 
Clubs. Reminders of our next 
meeting were given. The sub-
jects for the day were Thanks-
giving and Conservation. Mrs. 
Fred Wood was director of the 
program in the absence of 
Mrs. Opal Davidson. A skit, 
"Conservation Castastrophe", 
written by Mrs. Britt, was 
presented by Mrs. Harrison 
Hall and Mrs. Lewis Wright. 
Mrs. George Weems read 
"Thanksgiving" and Mrs. 
Wood read a prayer, "Let us 
Pause." 

Refreshments were served 
to Mesdames, Vida Brown, 
Mary Finsterwald, Harold 
Hill, Grace Pettit, Grace Por- 
ter, Mary Wofford, 	Mary 
Mitchell, and the members 
listed above. 

wife Helena attended the 
funeral of Gilbert Martin in 
Hollis, Oklahoma last Satur-
day. Gilbert was the brother of 
George. He had lived in Hollis 
all of his life, except about six 
months he lived in Wheeler. 

Dorothy Risner spent last 
week at A and M University, 
attending a meeting related to 
the work of Agricultural Stab-
alization and Conservation 
Service. Dorothy is the Execu-
tive hear of the local office. 
She has been an employee of 
ASCS for forty years. 

Mrs. Killingsworth, who has 

been in the hospital in Shat-
tuck, Oklahoma, was moved to 
the Parkview hospital here in 
Wheeler. about a week ago. 
She is improving. 

Tom and Venita Hopkins 
and son Tim, spent the week-
end with Venitas mother, 
Sallie Harris and their aunt, 
Nellie Horton. Tom attends 
the University of Minnesota at 
Minneapolis, this was his 
mid-term break. He also is 
visiting his parents in Albu-
querque. 

Nellie and Sallie drove to 
Amarillo Sunday and spent the 
night with their brother. Gus 
Brock, On Monday they at-
tended the funeral of Mrs. 
Carrie Brock Shirley in Friona. 
Mrs. Shirley was a cousin of 
Nellie and Sallie. 

Miss Tarita Signs, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Signs 
of Briscoe, Texas, became the 
bride of Johnny Sutton, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Sutton of 
Wheeler, at 7:00 P.M. Friday, 
November 21 in the home of 
the grooms parents. 

Rodney Weatherly, associ-
ate paster of the First Baptist 
Chruch of Wheeler preformed 
the ceremony. 

The brides bouquet was 
made up of beautiful satin 
peach colored flowers mixed 
with baby's breath and orange 
ribbons. The flowers arrange-
ments were peach carnations 
mixed with baby's breath. 
' The wedding music was 
provided by Pauline Sutton, 

Rape Seminar 
Monday, Dec. 15 

Rape. It can happen to any-
one, any age, at any time. 
You are a potential victim. 
don't let ignorance or apathy 
cost you your life. 

A special seminar address-
ing this subject will be held 
Dec. 15, 1980 at the Wheeler 
High School Cafeteria, at 7:30 
P.M. This program is spon-
sored by the Wheeler Cham-
ber of Commerce, and pre-
sented by Teresa Hefley and 
your local DPS 	officers. 
Women of all ages are invited. 
Men are also welcome. 

The Wheeler Senior Citzens 
organization met Dec. 1, 1980 
for their regular dinner and 
monthly business meeting. 

The business meeting was 
conducted and Willie Mae 
Stevens was elected president 
with Cordie Shumate as vice 
president. Due to illiness of 
the secretary-treasurer, Ida 
Farmer volunteered to fill in 
for her temporality. A delic-
ious meal was enjoyed by 21 
members and games of 88 and 
canasta followed. We welcome 
anyone to come join us for food 
and fun niter. 

"No pains, no gains." 
English proverb 

HEY KIDS! sT 1\TICIONIA.L 

BANK 

in Wheeler 
He's Making A List . . . 
And Checking It Twice R CHARLIE BROWN 

PRILIIIDKNT 

TO ALL OF OUR FIRST NATIONAL BANK IN WHEELER CUSTOMERS AND FRIENDS: 

a 

ep 

has received tremendous 
sponse from the citizens 
Wheeler County. 

"I am overjoyed that so 
many local citizens have joined 
me and my Association in the 
fight for good law enforce-
ment." Sheriff Ramsey said. 

"The people of this com-
munity have proven that they 
are truly concerned about the 
needs and problems we're 
facing in working to upgrade 
our departments. It's a good 
feeling to know they're willing 
to stand behind us." 

"The public's support will 
mean better training 	and 
higher standards for the law 
officers who insure the safety 
of our community," Sheriff 
Ramsey said. 

• • 
• 

• 
• 	• 	• 

• 

• • 
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You have heard by now that banks and savings and loan associations will be allowed 
by law beginning January 1, 1981, to pay interest on NOW Accounts. The maximum 
rate of interest at this time is 51/4%. First National Bank in Wheeler will pay 
the maximum on your average daily balance. There will be a minimum balance and 
to assure that your interest bearing checking account will be profitable to you, 
we want to have the opportunity to sit down and explain fully what our policy will 
be and believe that you will be more than happy with these services and all other 
First National Bank in Wheeler bank services. 

What is a NOW Account?  
A NOW (Negotiable Order of Withdrawal) Account is basically an interest bearing 
checking account. It is an account that can be used like a checking account to 
pay bills, get cash or for almost any other use that a checking account is presently 
used for. 
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TON)/ What is the difference?  
The major difference between a NOW Account and a regular checking account is that 
interest is earned on a NOW Account and not on a regular checking account. 

What is the interest rate I will be earning and the service charges for a NOW Account?  
Service charges on the NOW Account vary with the amount of your balance. Interest 
will be compounded monthly at 51/4% on your average daily balance. 

NOW Accounts or interest bearing checking accounts may not. ne for everyone. This is 
where our friendly personnel will be more than happy to discuss the advantages and/or 
disadvantages of having an interest bearing checking account. 

This year, send your 
letters to Santa Claus, 
c/o The Wheeler Times. 
All letters received on or 
before December 12 will 
be printed in the The 
Wheeler Times, December 
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I The First National Bank in Wheeler will continue to have regular savings accounts, 
checking accounts, and all of the other bank services we have had in the past, 
including regular Certificates of Deposit, money market Certificates of Deposit and 
the 30—month Certificates of Deposit. We will have a program to fit all of your needs. . 
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There will be no service charges for senior citizens (65 and over) on regular checking 
accounts. Please notify us.  

Sincerely, • I 	. S 
1,-1 ',Jr ',Li 

Charles R. Brown 
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HOLIDAY PRODUCE SPECIALS 

SUGAR LOAF 

PINEAPPLE 	EACH. 79` 
 

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 

LEMONS 	LB. 49` FLORID A FRH 

YELLOW SQUASH AB. 39` CALIFORNIA CRISP 
	1 LB. 
	  PKG. 35` 

Tail' CABBAGE LB 25` 

HUNT'S 
TOMATO 89 
KETCHUP :12: 8 

[ CERTIFICATES 1  

CERTIFICATES 

AVAILABLE HERE 

GIVE GROCERY, MEAT, 

TURKEY OR HAM 

CERTIFICATES 

AUNT JERMIMA 
LITE 	ist'zwai 
SYRUP 17  
SHURFINE 
DILL 
PICKLES 

?2 oz. 
-Jar $ 

09 

FOLGER'S COFFEE 

CRYSTALS 

CAMPBELL S NEW ,  CRIPSY TOMATO 2  
GARDEN SOUP 

SLICED BACON 
$ 1 59 

1 LB. 
PKG. 

OSCAR MAYER SLICED 

COOKED HAM 6 OZ 
PKG 

$ 1 69 

OSCAR MAYER LITTLE PORK LINK 

SAUSAGE 
	

LB '2' 

Or 

SUGAR FREE 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AID SAVINGS 

III 20' OFF LABEL DEODORANT OR ANTI-PERSPIRANT 
AEROSOL REG..UNSCENTED/POWD. DRY 

ON SALE THIS WEEK BEAUTIFUL IMPORTED 
STONEWARE MOUNTAIN WOOD COLLECTION 

5... 
WITH EACH 

55.00 PURCHASE 
49 

DESSERT DISH 
C 

10 CT 
BOX 79` 

60 CT. EX. $ 
ABSORBENT 
48 CT. TODDLERS 
90 CT. NEWBORN 

WE ACCEPT 
FOOD STAMPS 

Tis The Season For Holiday  6 
	 1. -Total Savin 	Thriftway  

SELECTED BAKERS 	'4^ 

IDAHO POTATOES c ,1 29  
DEL MONTE WHOLE 

BLUE LAKE 

BAKER'S ANGEL FLAKE 

COCONUT 

14 OZ. 	25' OFF 
$ 119 

PKG. 	LABEL 

 

TOTAL 
'.SAVER 

 

CENTRAL AMERICAN 

BANANAS 
LB. 33s  

Arg • I 11•1• • 

BAKER'S CHOCOLATE FLAVORED 

CHIPS 

12 OZ. 
PKG. 

HOLIDAY TOTAL SAYINGS 

KRAFT REAL 

MAYONNAISE 5159 

89` 
1002 $419  

JAR 

32 OZ 
JAR 

10'. OZ 
CAN 

FRITO LAY'S 
POTATO CHIPS Reg. 

$1.69 

Now 

$ 149 

FRESH DAIRY SPECIALS 

, 	MARGARINE 

SOFT PARKAY 

79c 
BIG COUNTRY BUTTERMILK 

BISCUTIS 	2 CANS 89` 10 CT 

MINUTE MAID PINK LEMONADE/FRUIT PUNCH 

LEMONADE 	 

U.S.D.A. GRADE 'A' CERTIFIED FINEST 
QUALITY COUNTRY PRIDE 

WHOLE 
FRYERS 

FROZEN FOOD SPECIALS 
• :•••• 

MORTON FROZEN 

MORTON FROZEN FRIED 

CHICKEN 	21308i 5279 

2-8 0 Z 
CUPS 

64 00 
CTN 

LB. 
WILSON'S CERTIFIED 

PO W. rt....4,••••70a • 	 „ 

CDR. PEPPERS  

Pack 
oz. 

an 

CUT-UP WHOLE PAN READY 

FRYERS 

LB 7 3 c  
YOUR THRIFTWAY STORES 
SELL 6 FEATURE ONLY FINE 

QUALITY AMERICAN GROWN 
GRAIN FED BEEF, FRESH PORN 

B. QUALITY POULTRY 

SPLIT FRYER 

BREASTS 

$ 1 29 
LB 

BREASTS-THIGHS-DRUMSTICKS 

PICK '0 CHICK 

$ 1 19 
LB 

FRYER PARTS 

DRUMSTICKS 

$ 1  19 
LB  

FRYER PARTS 

THIGHS 9 19 
LB 

OSCAR MAYER WIENERS REG.; JUMBO 

BEEF FRANKS 
OSCAR MAYER SLI. MEAT/BEEF/REG/THICK 

BOLOGNA  n"'"  

SCOTT PAPER 

TOWELS 

6 
Free 

Carry: Register For 
52000.00 Worth of 
BLUE STAMPS 

To Be Given Away Every 
Monday til Christmas 
No Purchase Necessary 

CHRISTMAS TREES 
ALL SIZES STARTING 
FROM $15.65—UP 

GET ALL YOUR 
CHRISTMAS ITEMS 

COUPON 

$159 1 LB. $ 1 89  
PKG.  

1207. $ 1 59  
PKG.  

RIGHT 
GUA 

RIGHT GUARD RIGHT 
GUARD 

10; 

 

3 OZ. DEODORANT 99. 
2.5 OZ. ANTI- 
PERSPIRANT 

 

JUMBO 
• ROLL 

   

4 ROl 
PR C; 

OH WHAT A RELIEF IT IS 

ALKA-SELTZER. 25CT 
PKG. 

SUPER DRY ANTI-PERSPIRANT 30' OFF LABEL 

SOFT & DRI 	
 

4 OZ 

SHAVE CREAM 11 OZ 
CAN 

TAMPAX REG./SUPER/1R. 

TAMPONS 

CONVENIENCE PAK DISP. 

PAMPER'S 
39 
YOUR 

CHOICE 

GOOD for $2000 

Worth of Blue Stamps 

With The Purchase of 

$10.00 or More 
63' 

EFFECTIVE 
OK. 7-13,1980 A PRKES 
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