
FUND SET UP FOR 
LANETA ARGANBRIGHT 

AT FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
IN WHEELER 

A fund has been set up at the 
First National Bank in Wheeler for 
Laneta Arganbright to help defray 
medical expense. 
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"Wheeler, town of friendship and pride." 

Tom M. Britt, Area Rancher, 
Dies; Rites Thursday, July 14 Mobeetie Plans Bluegrass Festival 

Dates are July 22,23,24 
CHAT 
WITH 
EDITOR CWE 

By Louis C. Stas 

The "Old Mobeetie Jail" will be the 
site of the 8th Annual Bluegrass 
Festival. The Panhandle Blue Grass 
and Old tyme Music Association 
sponsors the event each year. The 
dates for the activity this year will be 
July 22, 23 and 24, Friday, Saturday 
and Sunday. 

Time will be Friday: 8:00 p.m. 
until midnight; Saturday 2:00 p.m. 
until 6:00 p.m.; 6:00 p.m. to 7:00 
p.m. dinner break, 7:00 p.m. to 12:00 
midnight; Sunday, 10:00 a.m. to 12:00 
noon. Prices will be 2 day pass: 
$10.00, Friday night: $5.00; Saturday 
all day: $7.00; After 5:00 p.m.: $5.00; 
Sunday FREE!! Children 12 and 
under FREE. For ticket information: 
(806) 353-7950 or 381-2447. 

Positively no alcohol or drugs. 
Concessions furnished by Old 
Mobeetie Volunteer Fire Department. 

Our sympathy to the family of T. M. 
"Tom" Britt; he was a friend and will 
be greatly missed by everyone. 

-ewe- 
The weather has been great. We in 

town enjoyed a shower Monday after-
noon and in just the small area it 
covered the amounts ranged up to 
1/2 "; the official measure was 0.13 in-
ch. 

Services Held For Rubie 
Vaughan Christner 

A number of bands and/or groups 
have been scheduled to perform. To 
list a few: West Texas Ranch Hands, 
Now and Then, Smith Family Gospel, 
Sunrise, Tri-State Blue Grass Ex-
press, Southern Express, Knee Deep 
in Blue Grass, Burke Bros. and Sher-
man, Jack Selby and family, Charlie 

and Kiwi Hutchison and Bill Murry 
and The Plainsmen. The Top of Texas 
Cloggers will also perform. 

The festival is held each year in 
"Old Mobeetie" on the grounds of the 
"Old Jail" Museum. The site is in 
Mobeetie, 11 miles west of Wheeler 
on Highway 152 and south at the 
caution light. A limited number of 
camper hookups are available at the 
site. There is plenty of space for 
"camping in the rough". 

There are lots of trees for shade, 
but everyone is advised to bring their 
own lawn chairs. 

The show must go on—Rain or 
Shine. 

-ewe- 
The rain was greatly appreciated, 

but it certainly interfeared with my 
mowing. The yard looks like a 'hay 
adow' anyway—the grass had gotten 
so tall before I could get around to 
mowing—and now it is only partially 
mowed. My neighbors keep their yar-
ds looking so nice and they have to put 
up with me. And, those on Mobeetie 
Street have to look out at my garden. 
The rain helps the garden, but the 
weeds are doing better. 

-ewe- 
If you have noticed the 'highs' are 

missing from the temperatures for the 
week, we have happy to report the 
problem has been solved. KPDR-FM 
furnishes us this information and they 
have installed some new equipment 
which should record the highs ac-
curately. 

Tom M. Britt, 92, died Monday, 
July 11, 1988 in Ft. Worth, Texas, af-
ter a short illness, following surgery. 

Services will be Thursday, July 14, 
1988, at 10:30 A.M. in the First 
United Methodist Church of Wheeler. 
Rev. Carlton Thomson, District 
Superintendent of Seymour, Texas, 
and Rev. Weldon Rives, pastor, will 
officiate. 

Mr. Britt was born in Childress, 
Texas, on August 13, 1895, to S. P. 
and Janet Britt, a pioneer Panhandle 
banking and ranching family. He 
moved with his family to the Britt 
Ranch, east of Wheeler in 1913. He 
operated the ranch with his father and 
brother for several years and later 
with his son David. The grandsons, 
David, Jr., and Lewis also joined the 
operation. He retired from ranching in 
1974, but continued to live on the ran-
ch. 

On October 17, 1920, Mr. Britt was 
married to Vera Mary Barrett in Tem-
ple, Texas. To this union were born 
one son, David, and two daughters, 
Louise and Genevieve. Mrs. Britt 
preceded her husband in death on 
July 7, 1964. 

Mr. Britt attended the University of 
Illinois, where he was a member of the 
Farmhouse Fraternity. He was a 
generous financial supporter of many 
educational institutions, including 
Southwestern University, McMurry 
College and Texas A&M. 

Mr. Britt was a life long member of 
the Methodist Church and has been a 
very active worker and supporter of 
the church. He had been active in the Shanna Weatherly. (Back row, 1. to r.) 

Head Coach, Wayne Wheeler; 
Marcus Rose, Mark Nelson, Layne 
McCasland, Will Wheeler, J.W. 
Chadwick, Mike Johnson, and Asst. 
Coach Mike Davis. Not pictured,. 
Coaches J.C. Brooks and Kenneth 
McCasland and players Jed Brooks, 
Kimberly Beers, and Bryan Judd. 

Young Brothers 
Jubilee August 6 & 7 

Rubie Vaughan Christner, 82, 
died Friday, July 8, 1988. 

Services were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Monday, July 11, in First United 
Methodist Church in Shamrock. Rev. 
Steve Rogers, pastor, officiated. 
Burial was in Shamrock Cemetery by 
Richerson Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Christner, born at Lockes-
burg, Ark., came to Shamrock as a 
child with her parents. She attended 
schools in Shamrock. She graduated 
with summa cum laude honors with a 
bachelor's degree in geology from the 
University of Texas at Austin. She was 
married to James B. Christner in 1929 
at Marietta, Okla. He died in 1976. 
She taught and was a member of 
Philathea Sunday school class at First 
United Methodist Church. A son, Tom 
Christner, died in 1986. 

Survivors include two sons, John 
Hal Christner of Shamrock and 
MacGregor Christner of Wheeler; 
eight grandchildren and six great 
grandchildren. 

Pallbearers were grandsons Tom 
Christner, Vaughan Christner, 
Johnny Christner, Steve Hardin, Jeff 
Christner, Greg Christner, Dave 
Watson, and Brian Hardin. 

local church and was also active on the 
district and conference levels. 

Mr. Britt was a charter member of 
the Wheeler Kiwanis Club, served 
many years on the Wheeler County 
Draft board and also served many 
years as president of the Wheeler 
County School Board. 

T. M. Britt is survived by his son, 
David, of Wheeler; two daughters, 
Louise Carvey of Ft. Worth and 
Genevieve Caldwell of Clarendon; six 
grandchildren; seven great grand-
children and numerous other relatives 
and friends. 

Pallbearers will be David Britt, Jr., 
Lewis Britt, Sam Britt, Dr. Turner 
Caldwell, Douglas Carvey, Doug 
McLean, Ray Giddens and Glen 
Waldo. 

Honorary pallbearers will be 
Charlie Brown, Richard Brown, 
Richard DeArment, Harrison Hall, 
Thomas Helton, Grainger Mcllhany, 
Thurman Rives, Gordon Stiles, James 
Verden and N. D. Ware. 

Burial will be in the Wheeler 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Wright Funeral Home. 

I988WHEELER SUMMER BASE-
BALL PEE WEE CHAMPS: The 
Wheeler #2 Rangers put together an 
unbeaten season to win the league 
championship. There were 4 Wheeler 
teams, Briscoe and Miami that com-
peted for the title. Pictured (I. to r., 
front row) Angela Jolly, Michael 
Davis, Kendra Jolly, Deredah 
Weldon, Bradley Davis, Sally Smith, 

-cwe- 
• Mother Stas observed her 84th 

Tuesday. Those present was limited to 
the members of the household; this 
included one granddaughter and two 
great-grandchildren. Yes, she had 
cake and homemade ice cream. 

-ewe- 
Ronal Jr. and Jessica are in their 

second week, visiting the grandparen-
ts and Aunt Jennifer. 

-ewe- 
I had the opportunity to see the new 

softball complex at night from High-
way 152; it looks great. Of course the 
first opportunity to see the field with 
the lights on was with the ambulance 
last week—nothing serious. 

-ewe- 

FFA Members Attend 
State Convention Co. 4-H Style Review Held 	Sybil Nelson To Join 

Missionary Crusade 

Chamber of Commerce 

Has Monthly Meeting 

0 

The Wheeler County 4-H Fashion 
Show was held July 7 in the Briscoe 
School Auditorium. 

First place winners included 
Heather Ratliff, Briscoe 4-H, Junior 
Active Sportswear; Ken Nelson, Bris-
coe 4-H, Junior Casual Daywear; 
Jeremy Vorheis, Allison 4-H, Inter-
mediate Active Sportswear; and 
Meldoy Ratliff, Briscoe 4-H, Senior 
Evening Wear. 

Other entries included Leah Vor-
heis, Allison 4-H, alternate in the 
Junior Active Playwear; Jodie Crown-
over, Briscoe 4-H, alternate in the 
Junior Casual Daywear; Ember Brad-
street and Stacie Dukes, Wheeler 4-H, 
Junior Casual baywear; and Kristi 
Finsterwald, Wheeler 4-H,, alternate 
in the Senior Evening Wear. Lynette 
Snider, Shamrock 4-H, Senior Active 
Sports and Specialty Wear, was 
unable to attend the show. 

Awards were also presented to the 
best model in each age division. Best 
models were Stacie Dukes, Junior 
Division; Jeremy Vorheis, Intermedi-
ate Division; and Kristi Finsterwald, 
Senior Division. 

First place winners in the county 

fashion show will represent Wheeler 
County at the District 4-H Fashion 
Show at Borger, July 25. 

All of these 4-H'ers worked hard 
and long on their clothing projects 
for many weeks. They each should 
be commended for their effort. 

The leaders assisting and directing 
these 4-H'ers are from Allison, Mary 
Vorheis; Briscoe, Sue Ratliff, Vickey 
Nelson, Evelyn Meek, Sherry Wash; 
and Wheeler, Elaine Rodgers and 
Judy Woollard. Mothers, aunts and 
grandmothers also play an important 
role in assisting these youth. 

Judges for the fashion show were 
Mrs, Trudy Peters and Mrs. Kathryn 
Barjenbruch, Collingsworth County 
Extension Homemakers members. 

The first place gifts were donated 
by the Wheeler County Extension 
Homemakers Council and the refresh-
ments were provided by the Briscoe, 
Seamar and Briscoe Young Extension 
Homemakers Clubs. Extension Home-
makers attending were Evelyn Meek, 
Kathy Zybach, Ann Boydston, and 
Mary Vorheis. 

Stage decorations were done by the 
Briscoe 4-H Club mothers. 

o (EtI o e 3 

The Chamber of Commerce held 
their regular monthly meeting at 
Sparlin's Restaurant at noon on 
Tuesday, July 12. The topic of 
discussion was the success of the 3rd 
Annual 4th of July Celebration. 

The celebration was reported to 
have been a success with a number of 
the booths requesting reservations for 
next year. The "Fireworks Fund" 
adequately paid for the display and 
the remainder will remain in the 
special account for next year's 
display. 

The Chamber wished to express 
their "Thanks" to everyone for 
helping to make the event a success. 
The 1989 celebration will be on a 
Tuesday. 

The Chamber's calender shows the 
next activity to be the Fall Festival, 
scheduled for Saturday, October 15. 
All "Arts and Crafts" individuals are 
urged to mark this date on their 
calendars and plan to be in attendance 
at the annual event. Booth spaces are 
available to those wishing to display 
their talent. Individuals knowing 
others involved in this activity are 
asked to notify them; the more booths, 
the better the show. 

Five thousand Texas FFA members 
and guests are expected to attend the 
60th Annual Convention of the Texas 
Association of Future Farmers of 
America, July 13-15, 1988, at the San 
Antonio Convention Center, San 
Antonio, Texas. 

Attending from the Briscoe FFA 
Chapter are Shawn Zybach, Chad 
Morgan, Ben Meadows, David Gilmer 
and Mrs. Jack Morgan and Chapter 
Advisor Jack Morgan. 

Attending from the Kelton Chapter 
are Karla Harris, Lori Ray, Bobby 
Buckingham and Brett Buckingham 
and Chapter Advisor Andy Reed. 

The FFA is composed of students 
who are studying Agricultural 
Sciences in the public school in 
preparation for a variety of careers in 
Agriculture and Agribusiness. Agri-
cultural Sciences is well known for 
providing learning experiences to 
students through the FFA with the 
theme this year"FFA — Agriculture's 
New Spirit." The ultimate objective is 
to produce future leaders for Ameri-
can agriculture with its vital role of 
producing food and fiber. Texas now 
has more than 900 FFA chapters with 
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Everyone is invited to come to the 
Young Ranch on August 6 & 7 for a 
good time of worship and fellowship 
under the cottonwoods. The Young 
Ranch is located 22 miles north of 
Wheeler on Highway 83 and then 21/2  
miles west. 

The guest speaker for the 2 nights 
of Jubilee is Willie George, pastor of 
the "Church On The Move" in Tulsa. 
OK. Willie George is a Bible teacher 
and pastor in addition to being an 
internationally-known children's 
evangelist. Kids know him as gospel 
Bill from Dry Gulch, U.S.A. Willie 
began his ministry in the early '70's 
right here in Wheeler. He now 
ministers to multiplied thousands in 
live crusades and Via video tape in 
churches across America. Besides 
that, his television program is carried 
on two nationwide christian television 
networks (CBN and TBN). 

At the Young Brothers Jubilee, 
Saturday night's service will be 
preceded at 5 p.m. by a feast of 
charcoal-grilled hamburgers. (Bring 
your own salads, desserts, vegeta-
bles, drinks, etc.) The burgers, plates, 
cups, napkins, and forks will be 
furnished by the Young Brothers. On 
Sunday night, after the service, you 
can enjoy all the watermelon you can 
eat. 

Service time each evening is 7:30 
p.m. If you have never attended a 
Young Brothers' Jubilee, you don't 
know what you're missing. Come on 
out. You'll be glad you did. 

On July 17th at Dallas, Fort Worth 
Airport Sybil Nelson will join a team of 
men an women from across the United 
States for a Missionary World Service 
and Evangelism Crusade to Mexico. 
Sybil is a member of the Wheeler 
United Methodist Church. 

The team will fly via Mexicana to 
Mazatlan. The group will go by 
ground transportation to Durango, the 
site of their service crusade. They will 
take time out periodically from their 
work for sightseeing and shopping. 

On Sunday the crusaders will have 
an opportunity to work and fellowship 
with Methodist pastors and national 
Christians. The team will be directed 
by Rev. Larry Cochran, president of 
the sponsoring organization — Miss-
ionary World Service and Evangelism, 
P.O. Box 123, Wilmore, KY 40390. 

Members of the MWS&E staff are 
availabe for revivals, camp meetings, 
missions conferences, workshops and 
retreats. 

MWS&E also sponsors crusades to 
other countries; Colombia, Bolivia, 
Costa Rica, Ecuador, Finland, 
Honduras, Kenya, India and the 
Southwest Indian School in Arizona. 

First Baptist Church 
New Minister Of Music 

NEW ARRIVAL 
CHY$NA DeNAE ATHERTON 
The children of Russell and 

Noveta proudly announce the birth of 
their 'sister Chynna DeNae Atherton. 
Sher  weighed 7 lbs. 13 ozs. and was 20 
inches long. She was born July 16, 
1988. 

Old Admissions 
6-26 	Darcus Robinson 
7-4 	Mollie Selby 
New Admissions 
7-6 	Icyl Littrell 
7-7 	Paul Topper 

7-8 • 
7-9 
7-10 
Dismissals 
7-5 

Fliptian Patterson 
J. D. Tindol 
Vince Damon Remy 
Frances Kobernick 
Willie Burke 

7-6 WEATHER —1 

Date/Day 	Lo 
7-06, Wed. 	69 
7-07, Thurs. 	66 
7-08, Fri. 	 65 
7-09, Sat. 	 65 
7.10, Sun. 	64 
7-11, Mon. 	67 
7-12, Tues. 	65 
Low for the year: 
High for the year: 
Total moisture for month: 
Total for year: 
Total snow: 

7-7 

HI Pre 
91 0.00 
79 0.61 
85 0.01 
89 0.00 
88 1.29 
86 0.13 
93 0.00 

2-11, 02 
6-08,103 

2.25" 
12.34" 

11" 

7-9 

7-10 Domino 202 ET sired the heifer Qum n 
by Nacy. pictured at the halter. (Photo 
by American Hereford Association). 

NACY DAVIS SHOWS FIRST-PLACE 
HEIFER: Nacy Davis. Wheeler, won a 
blue ribbon at the $2,500 Lone Star 
State Regional Junior Hereford Courtesy: KPDR-FM Radio 

Classic hosted by her family's Davis 
Hereford Ranch. Wheeler. with this 
bred-and-owned late spring yearling 
heifer named NCD Regina 7015. 1.1 

Billye Wheeler 
Becky Zybach 
Heldn Sparlin 
Jess Davis 
Rudy Rivera 
Goldie Gordon 
Vincenta Ramos 
William Cross 
Vena Wall 
Nan Mixon 
Curtis Giddens 
Lewis Wright 
J. D. Tindol 
Avis Stas 
Paul Topper 
Margaret Goodwin 
Lewis Rogers 
Frances Kobernick 

The First Baptist Church in 
Wheeler welcomed Randy Rives as 
Minister of Youth and Music of their 
church this past Sunday. Randy is 
married. His wife, Tammy was raised 
in Dumas, Texas. She is a Registered 
Nurse. 

Randy came to Wheeler from 
Bonham, Texas where he served as 
Minister of Youth and Activities. He 
graduated from Southwestern Baptist 
Theological Seminary, Fort Worth, 
Texas in May, and had received his 
Bachelor of Arts in Bible from Howard 
Payne University in Brownwood, 
Texas in 1984. 

Prior to serving in the church at 
Bonham, Randy was Orchestra 
Assistant, Tate Springs Baptist 
Church in Arlington, Texas, and a 
member of Jubilation Brass, a church 
orchestra which performs at National 
conventions for the Sunday School 
Board and national Student Minis-
tries. He also served as Minister of 
Youth and Music at Blanket, Texas 
and Anna, Texas. We are happy to 
welcome them to our church and our 
community. 

TOM M. BRITT 
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HOUSE 

PAINTING 

AND LIGHT 

CARPENTRY, ROOFING, 

PLUMBING, AND ELECTRICAL. 

SPRAYED 
ON 

ACOUSTICAL 
TYPE 

CEILINGS 

DONALD FORD 
6-3106 

Listen to . . . 

KPDR-FM 90.5 
Wheeler, Texas 

KENT McLAUGHLIN—DEBBIE DARNELL 

PECOS 
SIX-SHOWERS! 

1 Full-gain. water-repellent leather. 
2 Rugged. sewn-welt construction. 
3 Cushion-soft. foctionning insole. 
4 Steel shank foot support. 
5 OWslip resistant sole and heel. 

an
d 

(6) Red Wing fit 

MAMA BCD E EE EEE 

10-14 9-15 8-15 716 714 41/2-16 6-15 644 714 

1155 

S 
(1.) 

MADE IN U.S A. 

House Of Lloyd 

Gifts, Toys, Home Decor, 

and Christmas Around the World 

OPEN HOUSE 
Thursday, July 14 

First National Bank 
Coin and Copper Room 

10 a.m. to 2 p.m. 

Come in and look. 

For more in formation, call .. 

Tina Deger 256-3407 

GERMANI AR MUTUAL 
citttaitofrt 

REASONABLE, SOUND PROTECTION 
for your home and other property, 

Rita Pearson: 375-2379 
E. A. Zybach: 375-2528 Office: 845-1002 

up the telephone, 
to comb their hat 

Dovie Wilson 
visited Ethel Rog 

talk and don't have 
r. 
and Eileen Logan 

ers last week. Ethel 

had been sick but is better now. 
No use praying for rain til the wind 

gets in the east. Maybe the rainy 
season will set in soon. 

WeCillift 
11 1 Mrs. Joe liners 

/elf /.$ 

got oursleves together and went over. 
Had such a good time, lots of visiting, 
good supper, homemade ice cream, 
etc. Charley Francis brought out a 
fiddle and mandolin. He and Joe 
entertained a while, ending with 
group hymn singing. 

Those present were Nina Lee Abla, 
Troy and Velma Gibson, Myrtle 
Flowers, Clarence and Lena Bartlett, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Abla, Rob and 
Dusty, John Earl and Jacque Francis, 
Charley Francis, Harold and Sylvia 
Hammon, Jean Flowers, Vesta 
Phillips, Zulu Caywood, Callie Braw-
ley, John and Hazel Francis, Melvin 
and Rosa Faye Abla, Linda Abla, 
Melissa and Machelle, Clifford and 
Leann Abla, Carolyn, Christi and 
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Chanda Abla, Julie Harding, Bob, 
Thelma, Kama and Shayne Abla, 
Derek and Carissa Dunlap, Marita 
Norrell, Charles Abla, and we three 
Joe, Lois and David Flowers, Ally 
Abla. 

Tuesday the Kitchen Band went to 
the Erick Home. The CA cousins plus 
Harold and Sylvia Hammon joined us. 
They all got an instrument and joined 
in. After a spread of cookies and 
punch set out by Carolyn McGuire, we 
went home with the Hammons for 
pie and coffee. Didn't need any 
supper. Those going were Myrtle, 
Callie, Zulu, Bertha Coffey, Troy and 
Velma, and we three. 

Other visitors at the home were 
Fern Howell and Editha Hildebrand. 
Editha is just back from a trip to CA to 
visit her brother Floyd Kline. Stephen 
is spending the summer with his 
mother. She said Nolan Roberts 
brought his mother Myrtle over to see 
while she was there. 

We are getting quite a few celebri-
ties around. There was a nice piece 
about Frances Ellis of Erick being 
sworn in as one of the first Rotary 
presidents in the Amarillo paper. Also 
one recently there about Marietta 
Hudgins and her sister having a 
birthday party. One was a 100 and the 
other almost. Cletus Killian and his 
"gators" have been getting a lot of 
publicity. 

Had a nice chat with Willie Lord, 
Otto and Ruth Atkinson, Bessie 
Taylor, Hortense Madden and cousin 
Clara. Clara is driving the Sayre 
Senior Citizen bus now. Drove the 
Cheyenne one for years. Don't know 
what we'd do if it wasn't for seeing 
people at the store. No one goes 
visiting anymore since they can pick 

July is marching right along. Big 
news out our way was the Home-
coming Saturday night and the fire-
works and such on the Fourth spon-
sored by our Volunteer Fireman Org. 
And no rain yet. Cousin Johnny Reed 
called one day to gloat a little. He'd 
had over two inches up on his part of 
Sweetwater Creek. 

There were well over a 100 at the 
reunion and I was one of the most 
ancient classes. Carl Garrett, Priscilla 
Davis and I were from the class of '33. 
There were four from Frank's class—
Inez Davis Shirley, J. M. Gamble, 
Lena Whipkey Luman, and Earl 
Tucker. Shirley Welch Spitzer was the 
only one from the class of '57 
(Tony's). She and her husband have 
moved to Sayre from PA. Rose Miller 
Rocha and Linda Bryan Daly were 
from the 61 class — Joe Dale's. David 
was the only one from the class of '67. 

Donaleta Fuchs was an able pre-
sident. Gale Thompson and Billy Hill 
will move up and Peggy Bryant was 
elected Secretary. Former teachers 
present were Pauline Roberts. 
Blanche Kuykendall, Betty Anderson, 
Eileen Logan. The Meridian Club 
served cookies and punch to everyone. 

The class of '43 had a reunion in 
the afternoon with 20 of the 22 grads 
present. In all there were some 40 at 
the party. Janie Bruner hosted a 50 
year party for the class of '38. Nine 
graduates and 2 spouses were pre-
sent. July 1, 1989 will be the next 
time. You all come. 

Ida Mae Rutherford visited her new 
little great granddaughter in Sham-
rock last week. Her name is Chelsea 
Lee. Parents are Alicia and Dan. 
Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Varner. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Mears and Janet 
spent Friday night with Esther 
Dickey. 

Seems to me if we are in such 
desperate need of day care centers, it 
would be better to pay the mothers to 
watch their own kids. if at all possible, 
every child should have a mother at 
home when he gets in from school. 

Mr. and Mrs. Royce Roberts 
attended the golden wedding of Mr. 
and Mrs. Pat McCord at Earth, TX. 
recently. Brought me greetings from a 
faithful reader Faye Stafford who used 
to live here. 

Visiting Ed and Eileen Logan this 
week were Leta Campbell, Erick, Eva 
Cotts, Sayre, granddaughter Step-
hanie Shoffner, Edmond, Laine and 
Leatrice Smith, Azted, N.M., and 
Sparky Eastham, Sayre, Lois Cupp 
Caldwell of Stillwater. Lois' dad, 
Albert Cupp carried our mail for many 
a year when we lived near Friendship. 
Was good to see her at Homecoming. 

Margie Bass, Berneal Bass, and 
Yvonne Meador were at the reunion. 
One of them told me she lived at Santa 
Rosa, N.M. They visited their aunt 
Birdie Whipkey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Joe Davis. 
Louise and family visited their mother 
Bethel, brother Eli and the children 
over the Fourth. 

Our Dawgs were out romping 
around when all of a sudden they went 
to howling like crazy. Enough to chill 
your blood. Stepped out and I could 
hear sirens over on the highway. 
Found out two fire trucks were racing 
north to a hay fire over on the Musick 
farm. Sure stirred those dogs up. 

Joe had three cousins come from 
CA for the Erick Alumni reunion. 
Callie Brawley, Myrtle Flowers, and 
Zulu Caywood. Their mother was an 
Abla so they are also cousins of Velma 
Gibson. On Monday, she and Thelma 
Abla called to say they were having a 
Flowers - Abla picnic at the park. We Cap Arrington 

Decendents Reunion 

To The Friends and Relatives of 
Kent McLaughlin and Debbie Darnell 

Our joy will be more complete 

if you can share in the marriage 

of our children, 

Debbie Darnell 

and 

Kent McLaughlin 

on Friday, the twenty-nineth of July, 

Nineteen hundred and eighty-eight 

at seven o'clock in the evening. 

First Baptist Church 

Mobeetie, Texas 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Darnell 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith McLaughlin 

Reception Following 

in't It The Truth 
By Ab Gunter 

The decendents of Cap Arrington, 
pioneer Texas Ranger and sheriff of 
Wheeler county held a reunion on July 
4th in the home of Pat and Doris 
Bourassa in Canadian. The family 
watched the Canadian Parade from 
the front porch of the Bourassa's 
home and had a wonderful bar-be-que 
lunch. In the afternoon the group 
toured "The Citadel" the beautiful 
home of Dr. and Mrs. Malouf 
Abraham. 

Inez Arrington Crenshaw celebrat-
ed her 91st birthday with this large 
family gathering. She recalled being 
baptized in the Baptist Church which 
the Abraham's have restored and 
made into a lovely home. Elizabeth 
Dunn Brady celebrated her anniver-
sary as she recalled being married 
thirty-seven years ago in that church. 
The family enjoyed the tour to the 
home and all the memories that went 
with the occasion. 

Those attending the reunion were 
Gary and Empress Terrell and family 
of Lubbock; William and Imogene 
Crenshaw of Bartlesville, Ok.; Inez 
Arrington Crenshaw of Daytona 
Beach, Florida; A.R. and Charlene 
Hoghland. Michelle Hoghland Nelson 
and family. Jennifer Hoghland Curlee 
and family, Cynthia Hoghland 
Schaffer and family all of Littleton, 
Co., Peter Arrington Long, Alison and 
Thomas Long, all of Ann Arbor, 
Michigan; Jim and Kay Batton of 
Mobeetie, TX; Jamie Hamilton and 
family of Elk City, OK; Betty Arring-
ton of Miami, TX; Mark and Nancy 
Arrington and family of Los Angeles, 
CA; Virginia Hoghland McDonald of 
Phonix, Arizona; Lucia Causey of 
Tempe, Arizona; Caroline Causey 
Dohm of Tucson, Arizona; Robert and 
Bobbie Dunn of Hot Springs Village, 
Arkansas; Dawn McDonald Emmett 
of Phonix, Arizona; Mike and Brenda 
Brownlee of Stratford, TX; Mary 
Guetersloh of Plains, TX; Toni Dunn 
of Lubbock, TX; Elizabeth Brady of 
Claude, TX; and Tracy Brady of 
Corsicana, TX. 

Jim and Kay Batton and Jamee 
Hamilton and Ashley of Elk City, OR. 
attended the Arrington family reunion 
in Canadian on July 4th. They helped 
celebrate the 91st birthday of Inez 
Arrington Crenshaw, the last living 
child of Cap Arrington. Kay reported 
that at ninety-one, Inez walks five 
miles three times a week, works as a 
hospital voluteer each week, and 
helps deliver meals-on-wheels to the 
elderly in Daytona Beach, Florida. 
She also plays the organ for church 
and memorial services. That strong 
pioneer hard-working spirit is alive 
and well in Daytona Beach! 
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Have you noticed all the termites 
climbing out of the woodwork in the 
Capital, guess I better say there in 
Washington. D.C. er you will think I 
mean Austin. Now you and me both 
know we ain't got any flimflamers in 
the Capital there er in Oklahoma City 
er in Arkansas er Louisiana that is that 
we know of but they shore shook the 
rug in D.C. A feller can't believe how 
the folks we have elected to Congress 
and so forth would tolerate such to 
happen without seeming to know 
anything about it. This kind of junk 
has been goin. on ever since we have 
had a government and always will 
but seems like it has again come to 
surface, most of us never heard of The 
Teapot Dome scandal er the ones that 
knew of it were involved er never 
really cared. We always say "Why 
don't they do something about it". 
Well pardner WE are the THEY if you 
really want to know. WE are the ones 
that put them in office, thats our 
Congressman, Senators, Representa-
tives and Presidents and many times 
we don't even vote or if we do we 
don't even know the ones we have 
elected. 

Not long ago it was sort of a fad to 
hire your wife as some kind of 
secretary and use the front porch for 
her office and put it down as 
necessary expenses for a few thou-
sand bucks and think nuthin about it. 

Not many months ago we were 
paying over six hundred bucks for 
toilet seats on some of them airplanes 
and over a hunched bucks for a pair of 
players to install the durn things and I 
bet we never did find out who was 
gettin the money. 

I member one time I was going to be 
a Flyboy for the US of A and we were 
stationed at Santa Anna Air Base and 
every month there was two bits taken 
out of our pay for Grass Seed, we had 
a few small lawns there but most of it 
was black top and very hot. One of my 
brighter moments I got to figerin that 
with all the thousands of us there at 
the base we were buying a hell of a lot 
of grass seed. Many months after the 
government sent me back to the 
Infantry I heard that some bird there 
in Santa Anna got caught on the grass 
seed deal. I doubt if the gent even had 
to do KP for his misdeeds but many of 
us kids shelled out two bits a month 
for grass seed. 

I hadn't learned my lesson cause 
back in the thirties I bought a Wild 
Pony from an Indian in New Mexico. 
This Indian was goin to bring it to 
town that nite and he must have forgot 
the way and all these fifty years I ain't 
seen that Indian er that Wild Pony. I 
got to go now, there's a feller going to 
sell stock in the Brooklyn Bridge and 
he's only going to be in town this 
afternoon, sounds like a good deal to 
me.... 

MAXEY'S 
. . . continues to 

lower prices 
on Summer Merchandise 

STEAKHOUSE 
S 

All  Summer Inventory 
Now 

CARD OF THANKS 
We thank you for your many acts 

of kindness, both while I was in St. 
Anthony's and since my return home. 
We love our community because of 
your thoughtfulness and your desire 
to help. 

Thursday Nights 
• • • 

All the Fresh Water 

Catfish & Shrimp 

you can eat. 

Served with onion rings, 
French fries, hush puppies 

and cole slaw. 
• 

Ann Gandy 

50O  
Super Savings 

in All Departments. 
While shopping our store, 

look at the wonderful 
fall lines arriving daily 

SUNDAY BUFFET 
Salad Bar 

Roast Beef Au Jus 
Fried Chicken 

w/Cream Gravy 
Whipped Potatoes 

Brandied Carrots 
Green Beans 

Hot Rolls 
Coffee/iced Tea 

Dessert 

Sun.—Noon. Buffet (Only) 11:30-1:30 

• Closed Monday • 
Phone: 826-3441 

1 Mile South of Wheeler on U.S. 83 

A fully loaded supertanker travel-
ling at its normal speed of 16 knots 
needs at least twenty minutes to 
stop. 

Love, Ab and Etenita 
-•••- 	 --.•••••.S-S. 

JENNINGS PLUMBING 
& ELECTRIC SERVICE 

Open 8:30 — 5:30 Monday thru Saturday 

46 	 49, 
i• , 

it 	to  i Appropriate Apparel 

"On the Square in Wheeler" 
Visa. Mastercard 

Welcome 

Owner: Larry Jennings 
" A flush is better than a full house." 

Roto-Rooter Service—Repairs—Remodeling 
Phone: 806/826-3153 	12 Years Experience 	 P.O. Box 423 
1110 South Main St. 	Reasonable Rates 	Wheeler, Tx. 79096 



All 1988 Zenith & RCA 
TV's gt VCR's 

on 

... 1989's Coming In! 
Watch the Nashville Network 

on Channel 16 on cable ready TV's 

110 W. Oklahoma 
Phone: 826-3241 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

If you or a member of your family has 
diabetes and takes insulin... 

discover 
freedom 
from 
needles 

with Medi-JectortZ 
no needles, 

more comfort, 
economical 

Needle-free insulin delivery system 

Discover what 15 thousand diabetic have 
discovered; the benefits of insulin delivery 
with modem Medi-jectory needle-free 
technology. Medi-Jector delivers insulin via 
a tiny stream, one-third the size of the 
thinnest needles. They feel nothing but the 
tiny stream of insulin. The Medi-Jector is 

classified as durable medical equipment, and 
is 80% to 100% covered by many insurance 
plans. Discover a life without needles_ 
Our trained staff will be happy to provide 
you with full details and a demonstration. 
Call or stop by. 

Authorized distributor for Oerata Corporation -Mecti-Jectork  

916 N. Crest Rd. 
Pampa, Texas 

ammiliMMINt 	 

Jim Baker, R. Ph. 
24 HR. PERSCRIPTION SERVICE 

Phone: 669-1035 Res 665-2749 

          

 

L. & F. REPAIR 
ZENITH T.V.'s 	R.C.A. T.V.'S 

SATELLITE ANTENNA SYSTEMS 

FRANK E. COATES, owNini 

  

 

P.O. Box 220 

WHEELER. TEXAS 79096 

PHONE 806/826-3241 

110 W. OKLA, 5T. 

    

          

FREE ESTIMATES 
	

24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

McCAIN'S AUTO BODY 
117 W. OKLAHOMA BOX 65 WHEELER, TX 79096 

PH. 806'826-3433 

INSURANCE CLAIMS 
	

OWNER: BOB McCAIN 

THE WHEELER TIMES 
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It has been nice weather the past 
few days, this Monday morning is 
nice, not much wind and a little 
cloudy. seems it has rained all around 

• us over the weekend but we just got a 
little shower and sprinkles. 

Red and Anna Dukes went to San 
Antonio, Texas last Friday. They 
visited Anna's son Jimmy Pewitt at 
Brooks Burn Center at Ft. Sam 
Houston in San Antonio. They left on 
Thursday and spent Thursday night 
with another son Claude Pewitt and 
family at Mineral Wells, Texas on 
their way down and on their way home 
Friday they spent Friday night with 

Stock Show. 
Dinner guests in the Bruce and 

Pearl Harrison home Sunday were: 
Hershel and Jeanette Sanford from 
Higgins, Texas, Louise Boydston, 
Sylvia Brown from Wheeler and Edith 
Levitt. 

(Thought for the day): Before you 
retaliate in kind, try kindness. 

Wilma Gilmer's Saturday evening 
supper guest were Ruby Craig, Lisa 
Farmer and Ryan from Pampa, 
Rhonda McWhorter, Tanner and 
Tyler from Wheeler. Lisa and Ryan 
spent Saturday night and Sunday with 
Ruby. 

who have spent two weeks with their 
aunt and uncle. They returned home 
Monday. 

Alton and Arier Lohberger and 
Russel stopped by George and Avis 
Parkers Sunday night on their way 
home from church and visited awhile, 
and also Winnie Kiker visited awhile 
Sunday evening. 

Wanda Walker, Melissa, Melody, 
Jonathan and Justin and Neal Boyd-
ston went to the Pizza Hut at 
Shamrock after church Sunday morn-
ing and ate lunch. Melissa Walker 

Listen to . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
Wheeler, Texas 

Anna's daughter Sylvia and Joe 
Richardson at Bridgeport, Texas. 

Last Sunday Red and Anna were 
dinner guest at Dub and Bessie 
Crewshaw's home at Shamrock, TX. 
Others there were Tommy and Adline 
Hays and family from Panhandle. The 
Hays boys also had a friend with 
them. 

Ruben and Edna May went to 
Petrolia, Texas and spent last week-
end with James May and family. 

Those enjoying a 4th of July party at 
Suzanne Lohbergers home were 
Virginia Slaton and children, Louis 
and Rita Grayson and Terry, Joe and 
Debbie Rucker and family, Alton and 
Ariel Lohberger and children, Aleta, 
Justin and Dawson Lohberger from 
Sweetwater and Verne and Susie 
Lohberger. They all had a good time 

-eating, visiting and swimming. 
The United Methodist hosted a 

going awawy party last Thursday 
evening at the Methodist Church for 
Mr. and Mrs. John Schreiber and 
family. They served ice cream and 
cake to a large crowd. The Schreibers 
left last Saturday for Lubbock where 
he will be teaching. 

Zeland and Charlene Rainey left 
last Friday going to Branson, Missouri 
to visit Les and Shronda Seamster and 
they will bring their grandchildren 
Danette and Scot Dyer back with them 

Care Center 

Comment 

Phone: 826-S907 
FREE ESTIMATES 

MAX McQUEEN 
P.O. Box 754 — Wheeler, Texas 

WHEELER 
PLUMBING 

Highway 83 North 

New Construction 

Remodel 

Repair 

Sewer Service 

Wheeler Flower 
& Gift Shop 

ButchMoore,Owner 

APC.Cle0 
JACIE DAWN HOOD, is the 9 
month old daughter of Joel and 
Stacy Dawn Hood, of Aledo, TX.; 
granddaughter of Bob and Delores 
Weatherly of Wellington, TX.; 
great granddaughter of Nana 
Weatherly of Wheeler, TX. 
For all your ... 
Insurance Needs, See 

Sitt Moose mos 

15 off 
Come in and Browse 

Phone: 826-5943 	 110 E. Texas 
Home: 826-5704 	 Hours: 8:30-5:30 

The McCasland-Smith 
Agency 

a 

117 W. Texas St.—Wheeler, Tex. 

806/826-3573 
*Auto *Home *Life *Health 

*Commercial 	* Bonds 
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returned home last Saturday from 
Pampa where she had spent a v.tek 
with Lisa and Calvan Farmer and baby 
sit Ryan while they were at work. 

Bessie Giddens, daughter Lavesta 
and Don Barber of Borger was 
returning home from a two weeks 
vacation last Sunday and were at 
Bessie's when she got home from 
church Sunday morning. (Nice 
surprise.) Don and Lavesta had toured 
several states. The farthest one was 
Virginia. They spent Sunday night 
with Bessie and went home Monday 
morning. Bessie enjoyed their visit 
and they showed video tapes Sunday 
night of Nena's wedding. 

Ray and Sue Giddens Sunday 
afternoon guest were her parents. 
Glen and Nona Elmore. 

Louis and Rita Grayson's guest 
from Thursday morning until Friday 
afternoon was Rita's dad, L.S. 
Aderholt, from the Care Center at 
Wheeler. 

Pete and Margaret Gilmer went to 
Amarillo the 4th of July and visited 
Rodney and Linda Ingersoll and 
Andrew and watched the fireworks 
Monday night from Rodney and 
Linda's front yard. They live close to 
the fairgrounds. Pete and Margaret 
spent a couple of nights with Becky 
and Jeannie Gilmer. They all shopped 
and visited and just had a good time. 
came home on Wednesday. 

Last Friday Bruce and Pearl 
Harrison went to Elk City for Bruce to 
see the doctor and spent the night 
with Inez Townsley and attended a 
Sunday School rally Friday night at 
the United Pentecostal Church in Elk 
City. 

Hershel and Jeanetta Sanford were 
Sunday overnight guest at Bruce and 
Pearl's. 

Peggy Chandler's weekend guest 
was Cindy Burrus, Tiffany and Bret 
from Canyon, Texas and Brad and Sue 
Chandler, Jana and Bridget from 
Briscoe. Cindy did a lot of yard work 
and cleaning up around the place 
while she was there. 

Opal and Juanita Boydston went to 
Amarillo last Friday for Juanita to see 
Dr. Carrillo and then they spent the 
night 'with Warren and Charlene 
Brown and returned home Saturday. 

Louise Boydston's guest from 
Wednesday to Friday was LaQuinta 
Hulse, Michael and Michelle from 
Oklahoma City. Lynette O'Donnel and 
girls returned to Oklahoma City with 
La Quinta and spent Friday with her 
and her family. LaQuinta and her 
children and spent Friday with her 
and her family, LaQuinta took them to 
ther airport Saturday morning where 
they took a plane to Houston where 
they met Steve, their husband and 
dad. 

Shorty and Helen Crawford attend-
ed the 4th of July parade at Canadian 
on the 4th. 

J.R. and Leota Black went to the 
Continued Page 4 

BURRELL PHILLIPS 66 
Phone: 826-3744 
	

E. Hwy 152, Wheeler, TX 
7 a.m. to 7 p.m. — Mon.-Fri. 

Open Saturday 7 a.m. to 7 p.m.—Closed Sunday 

Down on the FARM 

WATCH 
WELCOME TO 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
8TH AT MAIN • P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 790% 

Church (806) 826-3114 - Parsonage 18061 826-3079 

Sunday School 	9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6:00 p.m. 

HA YDON CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 
28th & Perryton Parkway Pampa, Texas 

Phone 665-7261 
Dr. Mark W. Ford, Jr. 	 Dr. Louis Haydon 

FOR 
POWER 

LINES 

By Christine Gilmer 
Isaiah 55: 6 & 7: 

Seek ye the Lord while He may be 
found, call ye upon Him while He is 
near; 

Let the wicked forsake his way, and 
the unrighteousness man his 
thoughts; and let him return unto the 
Lord, and he will have mercy upon 
him; and to our God, for he will 
abundantly pardon. 

The rain was just wonderful that we 
received last Wednesday evening. My 
gauge showed just almost an inch and 
a half. 

Visitors at Clyde and Minnie Bell 
Vinson last week was Clyde's brother 
William and wife Joyce from Charles-

*? ton, South Carolina. William and wife 
visited with Clyde and Minnie Bell 
from Tuesday until Friday. Joyce 
visited part of the time in Amarillo 
with her mother. Their daughter and 
husband Mr. and Mrs. Rick Barche-
sky and their three daughters from 
Denver also spent Tuesday with the 
Vinsons. 

Mr. and Mrs. D.W. Bird from 
Albuquerque and their daughter Carol 
also from Albuquerque visited from 
Monday to Friday with Clyde and 
Minnie Bell. 

Tuesday, July the 5th Clyde and 
Minnie Bell were in Pampa shopping. 

The Gibson—Bowling family 
reunion was held last weekend July 
2nd and 3rd at the Hilton Inn in 
Amarillo, TX. with about 100 people 
attending. The children of Edward 
and Lena (Bowling) Gibson, Edith 
(Gibson) Levitt of Allison, Anna B. 
(Gibson) Waters of Happy, Texas and 
Goldie (Gibson) Reed of Amarillo 
were in attendance. Another daughter 
Roina (Gibson) Wall of the nursing 
home in Dumas was unable to attend. 
The three sisters present had honor-
able mention with Eidth, 86, being the 
oldest person present and Opal (Wall) 
and Hank Grindstaff traveling the 
longest distance 1500 miles. The 
youngest one was a great grandson of 
Anna B. Gibson Waters. Some of the 
others present were: Glen Waters and 
family from Odessa, Donald Roy 
Waters and family from Hereford, 
Texas, Keith Waters and family from 
Stratford. Texas, Lyn Levitt and 
family and Michelle Tyler and sons 
from Panhandle, Texas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Waters from Happy, TX. 
Mrs. Della Fae Sports and daughter 
from Lubbock, TX. Mr. and Mrs. 

Johnnie Reese and her sister Rita 
Halmack and husband from El Paso, 
Texas, Roy and Evelyn Langford and 
daughter Edith Ann Della Crace and 
baby Rachel, and Gwyn Krueger all of 
McAllen, Texas, Neil Wall and family 
from Olton, Texas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Palser of Dumas, Rev.. and Mrs. 
Jerry Dawson from Dallas, Texas, Mr. 
and Mrs. Carall Lewis from Amarillo, 
Texas, Mr. and Mrs. Frank A. 
Dawson from Borger, Texas, Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Waters from Amarillo, 
Texas, Ronnie Reed from Tulsa, 
Oklahoma, son of Goldie Reed of 
Amarillo was unable to attend. Mr. 
and Mrs. Easton Wall and children 
were present. 

The noon meal was catered by the 
Hilton Inn and reservations were 
made earlier for any one staying 
overnight at the Inn. 

Glen Waters and stepdaughter 
entertained the group with several 
musical numbers on the violin (fiddle) 
and guitar. 

Edith Levitt gave a reading handed 
down from several generations; (my 
trip down to Boston). Keith Waters 
gave his church testimony and Neil 
Wall acted as Master of Ceremonies. 
Most people departed later in the day 
declaring the day well spent with 
many happy memories. Opal Wall 
Grindstaff, Nella Rose Lewis. Neil 
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	Wall. many others were given credit 
from arranging the place and purpose 
for the day which was enjoyed by all. 

A bridal shower for Dawn May, 
bride-elect of Destry Coulter was 
given Saturday, July 9th at 10 a.m. at 
the Fellowship Hall of the United 
Methodist Church with hostesses as 
follows: Sharon Hall, Winnie Kiker, 
Darenda Begert, Carol Kiker, Gena 
Zybach, Janette Rainey, Katrina 
Pendergrass. Donna Nall and 
Ladonna Elmore. 

A breakfast luncheon was enjoyed 
by a large group of well wishers 
before the many gifts were opened. 

Roy and Evelyn Langford, Edith 
Ann Della Crace and daughter Rachel 
and Gwyn Krueger all from McAllen, 
Texas visited Edith Levitt last week 
and attended the Gibson, Bowling 
reunion in Amarillo at the Hilton Inn 
Sunday, July 3rd. They also spent the 
night Sunday with Lyn Levitt and 
family at Panhandle. 

Hiram and Darenda Begert and 
Bret arc in Des Moines. Iowa at a Fat 

By Lois 
This has been a very long two 

weeks. My vacation wasn't exactly 
what I intended. It was spent in St. 
Anthony's Hospital with my son 
(Rodney) who had his appendix out. I 
decided to come back to work to get 
some rest. Hal It is nice to be back. If I 
can just get caught up on everything. 

This will be two weeks rolled up in 
one. If I miss anything or anyone 
please give me another chance. 

Mildred Porter has been so faithful 
to come every Monday. Thank you so 
very much. 

Opal Davidson was so kind to serve 
juice on Monday afternoon the 27th. 

Monday, July 4th the kitchen staff 
made lunch something special. They 
served grilled hot dogs and home-
made ice cream picnic style. The 
dining room was decorated and they 
also sang some songs. It was quite a 
celebration. Thanks to all who worked 
and made this day very special for the 
residents. 

We want to thank the Wheeler 
Flower Shop for sending some beauti-
ful flowers for our residents to enjoy 
on Independence Day. 

Tuesday the 28th was our monthly 
domino tournament. Bonnie Davidson 
was kind enough to over see and make 
sure everything went smooth. The 
volunteers who came to play were: 
Mrs. Oleta Jones, Mrs. Marie 
Gudgel, Dorothy Hayes, Jack Hayes, 
Sally Harris, Fannie Mae Bradstreet, 
Eli Sabbe, Grace Burk. Susan David-
son, Julie Davidson, Casey Velasquez 
(watched), Lloyd Davidson. Thank you 
to all who came to play. 

Our bingo volunteers were Lola 
Holcomb on June 29th (all by herself) 
and Doddie Phillips, Doraeen Owen, 
Ila Byers, and Opal Hefley on July 
6th. Thank you for coming and 
helping out while I was gone. 

Thursday morning, 30th, the 
Christian Center Devotional was 
really nice. On the (7th) the Inspira-
tional was again held. I don't have a 
list of names of who helped but you 
are much appreciated. 

Thursday afternoon our mending 
ladies came. They were Bea Smother-
man, Essie Finsterwald, and Ora 
Underwood. They worked for quite 
awhile. Thank you ladies very much. 
See you next week. (14th) 

We had our popcorn poppers here 
the 30th and 7th. They were Ann 
Ellison and LaJaune Alexander and 
Lavelle Stephens. I'm sure all enjoyed 
it very much. Thank you. 

Fannie Mae Bradstreet and Ruth 
Taylor came several times to serve 
juice and visit. Thank you. 

Rev. Jim and Laura Davis were here 
the 1st and 8th from Mobectie 
Methodist Church for Bible Study. 
Thank you for coming. 

We would like to thank Shorty 
Sechrist for the 2 bushels of fresh 
peaches he delivered to the residents. 
The kitchen served them fresh, even 
diabetics were able to enjoy them. Mr. 
George Gandy donated some apricots. 
These were made into cobbler and 
everyone said it was delicious. Thank 
you so much. 

We have three residents in the 
hospital at this time. Icyl Littrell, Will 
Burk. and Gene Robinson. We hope 
they'll soon be feeling better. 

Remember if I failed to mention 
your name and acknowledge your 
kindness, you are still much appreci-
ated. Please come see us. 

Thank You, 
Lois 

Power lines can be dangerous. 

Touching irrigation pipe to a power line can 
divert the electricity through the pipe . . . and 
to anyone in contact with it. In this part of the 
country, this is the leading cause of farm 
injuries and deaths in electricity-related 
accidents. Any equipment of unusual height 
represents a potential danger. Lift arms on 
field equipment, combine auger spouts and 
even radio antennas can 
cause serious injury or 
death if they, and you, 
make contact with a 
power line. 

Keep an eye up for 
power lines. Watch  up, 
for safety's sake. 

4 SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY 
C SOS 1987 



the smith agency 
it RUTH SMITH, Broker 	GREG SMITH, Salesman 

JOE LEE, Salesman- 375-2380 
LONA WILLIAMS, Salesman - 826-3341 	BETTY LEE, Salesman-375-2380 
LANA BRADSTREET, Salesman - 826-3354 	JIM HILL, Salesman-826-3094 	LAVON WILLIAMS, Salesman Appraiser- 826-5803 

Phone: 806/826-5541 or 826-3238 

New Listings . . . / 3 BR, 2 bath, stucco home with 
basement and double garage on 
corner lot. #64 

1 3 Br, 2 bath brick home with 
large garage, cellar and storage 
building on large corner lot. #65 

1 3 BR, 2 bath home with single 
car garage. Assumable FHA loan. 
#66 

issamaltfr . 

re 1001 x150' lot with level lawn, 

Residential Listings. . • garden spot, fenced yard and 
trailer hook-up. 57 

✓ 3 BR, 1 bath, convenient to 
Downtown. 6 

v 3 BR, 1 bath home with 
carport, edge of town. Assumable 
loan. 28 
p' 2 BR, 1 bath Stucco Home. 
Also small rent house on corner lot. 
Owner will finance. 2 

V 2:  BR, 1 bath house on .large 
corner lot, carport. 22 

V 	3 BR, 2 bath, detached garage. 
Large fenced yard. Low move-in 
cost. 1 
V 3 BR, 1 bath Stucco Home, 8 
miles East of Wheeler, small 
acreage. 31 

V 3 BR. 11/2  bath frame home on 
corner lot. Double garage, central 
air, good floor plan. 50 

V 3 Br, 1 bath stucco with 2 apts. 
rented to make payments. 	#58  

✓ Large 3 BR, 2'/2 bath brick home 
on 50 acres east of Wheeler with 
game room, vaulted ceilings, fire-
place, double garage, and many, 
many more extras. Owner would 
consider trading for house in town. 
51 

V 3 BR, 2 bath home with Large 
Plant 24 room, basement and double 
garage. 

 

V 2 BR, 1 bath, single car 
garage, assumable FHA loan. 29 

j." 3 BR, 1 bath, home with single 
car garage. Assumable FHA loan. 

✓ 2 BR, 1 bath, stucco home on 
corner lot, close to downtown. #59 

3 BR, 1 1/2 bath, central heat 
and air, fenced yard, new built in 
appliances, custom blinds, ceiling 
fans, across from park. Priced to 
sell at 548,500.00. 13 

V Reduced to $15,000.00. Cafe in 
Mobeetie. 39 

of 3 BR, 2 bath, home with 
sundeck, fireplace, duststopper 
windows and doors, total electric 
central heat and air, carport, 
workshop, storm cellar, large 
fenced yard with landscaping. Low 
utilities - Like New! 23 
✓ 3 BR, 2 bath, stucco home on 5 
acres at the edge of town. Ideal for 
a Veterans Land Board loan. #54 
pow 100' x 150' vacant lot with 
hookups and well house on high-
way on South edge of town. 34 

MOBEETIE . . . 
3 BR, 2 bath Modular home 

with fireplace evner will lease 
with option to3uy. 49. 

✓ 3 BR, 2 bath mobile home in 
Mobeetie with fireplace. 38 

FARM & RANCH . . . 
1/2  section of grass West of 

Mobeetie. 42 

v Large 4 bedroom, 2 bath home 
with fireplace and basement on 
2.80 ac. in country. 32 

2 BR, 1 bath house with barns 
and pens 6 4- acres. 33 

V 30 acres of irrigated alfalfa 
with irrigation well and 2 sprinkler 
systems at the edge of Wheeler. 45 
V 3 BR, 1 3/4 bath, large Brick 
Home with Fireplace, Double 
Garage, Office, Cellar, Basement 
and 234 acres of Crossfenced 
Lovegrass. 46 

We have CRP land available 
If  

After Hours Wheele
r 

I0 
111 W. Texas, 	 1 

COME VISIT US 
We Appreciate Your Business  C  

rr-lZoo' ..c0111C4.1-4 - FOR RENT: Nice brick 
country home-$500 monthly-
deposit-4 bedrooms/3 baths 
Jones, 826-5207. Want Ads 

House For Sale: 2 miles east 
of town, S bedroom, 2 bath, 
1.7 acres. owner will help 
with down payment. 
826-3394. 

Adams Rentals FOR RENT:3 bedroom fur-
nished trailor. 826-3112. 

New Hours Mon.-Sat.: 1 p.m.-9 p.m. 
Sun.: 1 p.m.-5 p.m. 

1. Full Metal Jacket 3. Fatal Attraction 
2. Nuts 	 4. Fatal Beauty 

FOR SALE: 1970 Nomad 
Travel Trailer 18' $1600. 
826-3021. 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING 
1/2  Beef, Beef cuts and Pork. 
Shamrock Slaughter Plant, 
We accept food stamps., 

'256-3241. NEED A BABYSITTER? 
Call 826-5852 Ask for Angel 

For Rent: Furnished 2 bed-
room trailer, clean, $150 
month 826-3586 or 826-5634, 
ask for Donna. 

WAITRESS WANTED 
Apply In Person 

SPARLIN'S 
RESTAURANT 

Call or See JIMMY ADAMS, Wheeler' 
After 6:00 P.M. 

• NEW LISTINGS • 
3-3 Bedroom Houses 

1-1 Bedroom Apt., Furnished 
1-1 Bedroom House, Furnished 

2-2 bedrooms apts. 	1-1 bedroom house 
1-2 bedroom house 

tin.7-sia>.- ..altms.er"."Irs ries 	.../Zroi.2."'S 

Real Estate 
Appraisal & Sales 

Lavon Williams 
The Smith Agency 

826-5541 	826-5803 

GET PAID for reading books 
$100.00 per title. Write: 
Pase-E1136, 161 S. Lincoln-
way, N. Aurora, IL 60542. 

FOR RENT: Efficiency 
apartment call after 4:00 
826-5976. 

IF YOU BUY HEALTH 
INSURANCE, you could be 
paying too much. Special-
izing in Major Medical and 
Medi-Care Supplements. 
Contact: 	Kenneth 
McCasland 826-3573 or 
826-3036. 

(central heat and air) 

NOTICE 
Wheeler County will hold a 
public hearing on the pro- 
posed 1988-89 budget for 
Wheeler County at 10 a.m., 
Monday, July 11, 1988, in 
the Commissioners Court 
Room, Wheeler County 
Court House, Wheeler, 
Texas. Copies of the Pro-
posed budget are available 
in the county judge's office 
for public inspection. 

DEPOSIT REQUIRED ON ALL RENTALS i 
FOR SALE OR RENT: 
Mobile home lot, 100'x150' 
S. 	Stanley. 	Call 
316/697-2678. 

MEMBER 1988 1988 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 
RICHARD'S 
UPHOLSTERY & 

CARPET CLEANING 
Furniture. etc. 

CALL: Richard Laverty 
Mobeetie, Texas 

HOUSE FOR SALE OR 
LEASE: Can be seen at 1211 
S. Mobeetie. For appoint-
ment call 826-3744. 

Easy Work! Excellent Pay! 
Assemble products at home. 
Call for information. 504-
641-8003 Ext. A-8424. 

Shamrock Laundry 
Open 24 Hrs. 

7 Days a Week 
Corner of 4th & Madden St. 

Shamrock, TX. 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY  
Buy Government seized ve-
hicles from 5100. Fords, 
Chevys, Corvettes, etc. For 
info call (213) 925-9906 ext. 
3158. 

V Experienced 
COOK 

APPLY IN PERSON 

SPARLIN'S 
RESTAURANT 

MME 
HAY FOR SALE: Lovegrass 
Extra Large, fertilized, 
round bales, $20 each. 
826-5731. 

FOR SALE: 1976 14 x 80 
Mobil Home, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, nice carpet, many 
extras. 7000 or best offer in 
Canadian. 806/323-8606 

Carolyn 's 
Video's 
400 S. Main 

Nintendo 

TAPES 
*Pinball 
*R.C. Pro-Am 
*Goonies II 
*Ice Hockey 

Mon.-Fri.: 8:30-6:30 
Sat.: 8:30 -7:00 

Sunday: 1:30-6:00 N 

sue' FOR SALE: 14x72 3 bed-
room, 11/2  bath, remodeled 
mobile home, priced to sell. 
Call 826-3701. 

LEGAL NOTICE af 

CARPORT SALE: Thurs. 
July 14, 8:00-5:00, 1207 S. 
Mobeetie, furniture, 
clothes, bicycles, toys, lots 
of miscellaneous. 

GARAGE SALE 4:, 
HELP WANTED 

For nursing assistants. 
Contact the director of 
Nurses in person at: 

WHEELER CARE CENTER FOR SALE IN MOBEETIE: 
60 acres, Part farm land and 
grass with lots of trees, 3 
bedroom brick house, 2 full 
baths, large den, utility 
room, fireplace, large den, 
Lg. 2 car garage, 7x14 
cement storm cellar, 3 good 
water wells, two large barns 
15x30 hog farrowing house 
and 5 acre peach orchard. 
665-2779 days, 845-2971 
evening. 

P.O. Box 1080 

HOME CARE ATTEND-
ANCE needed to provide 
personal care and house 
keeping tasks for the 
Wheeler 	area. 
1-800-727-2778 ext. 19, 
E.O.E. 

Phone: 826-3123 
GARAGE SALE: Friday 
ONLY. Lots of clothes. 1 
mile south red light, in the 
large barn. Joe Smith. 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office of Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

The Wheeler Indepen-
dent School District is seek-
ing bids on the following 
items for the 1988-89 school 
year. If you would like to 
participate in the bidding, 
please have your figures in a 
sealed envelope August 10, 
1988, 3:00 p.m., addressed 
to Supt. Doyle Wilson, Box 
1010, Wheeler, Texas 
79096-1010. Please specify 
on the outside of the envel-
ope that it contains a bid. 
Please specify size or weight 
where applicable. BREAD: 
sliced sandwich bread,' 
hamburger buns, hot dog, 
buns, Texas toast. MILK: 1/2  
pint homogenized milk, 1/2  
pint chocolate milk, 'A pint 
lowfat Homogenized milk, 
1/2  pint Lowfat Chocolate 
milk. GASOLINE: Regular 
gasoline. 

NOW HIRING 
Government Jobs, skilled 
and unskilled in your area. 
For current list of jobs and 
application call (602) 995-
0682 ext. 3158. Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES:  

Wheeler County. . . $13.50 Outside County. . .$15.00 

	ammemso=timillP GARAGE SALE: 301 N. 
Main Friday 9-5, Saturday 
9-? bathtub, sink, aquarium, 
chairs and misc. 

B & B Electric 
dt 

Appliance 
Repair 

On all make and models 

ATTENTION: Foran Pro-
, duction Co. is buying pro-
) clueing and non-producing 
minerals and leases. Please 
contact Mark R. Stewart, 1st 
National Place I, 801 S. 
Fillmore, Suite 450, 
Amarillo, TX. 79101 or call 
806/376-6584. 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath country home, 1.03 
acres, excellent condition, 
91/2  miles east of Wheeler. 
Call 826-3586 weekdays 
from 8:30 til 5:30. 

HOME FOR SALE 
West 7th, fruit, shade 
trees, cellar, shop, wind- 
mill, 18 lots, fenced, 
26,000, 826-3074. 

fltUJOUI  IF /\•/ ent, to, 

GARAGE SALE: 6% miles 
east on Hwy 152. Clothes, 
backpack tents, dishes, fish-
ing equipment, exercise 
equipment and misc. Sat. 
ONLY 9 to 5. 

AA MEETING 
Alcoholics Anoymous 

meets at 8:00 p.m.in the 
Commissioners Court 
Room of Wheeler Co. 
Courthouse on Thursday 
of each week. 

FOR SALE: 1974 two bed-
room 10'x65' Mobile Home, 
furnished kitchen, washer & 
dryer, King size waterbed, 
$5,000. Also 1984 Thunder-
bird, 70,000 miles, $5,000. 
Contact Dave Johnson at 
Kelton, 826-5715. 

For Sale: Bobwhite Quail 
Ready to turn out. 845-2551. 

' Authorized Sears service 
No Mileage or Trip Charge 

25 Years Experience 
Call McLean Collect 

779-3252 TWO CUTE KITTENS TO 
GIVE AWAY. Ruth Smith, 
826-3526. 

Wheeler Lodge No. 1099 

A. F. & A.M. 

MONDAY 
7:30 P.M. 

TEXAS 
FARM BUREAU 
Insurance Companies 

Gary Alston 
Agency Manager 

Ted Boedeker 
Agent 

Phone: 806/826-3563 

YARD SALE: Lots of every-
thing. Last house on South 
end of old airport road. July 
18 & 19 Monday and Tues. 
9:00-5:00. 

Laundry Equipment For 
Sale: 14 washers, 8 dryers 
and a new 100 gal. hot water 
tank. See at Beasley Laun-
dry or call after 6, 826-3623. NOTICE 70 PUBLIC 

Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing or reputation of 
any person, firm or corporation, 
which may appear in the columns of 
this paper will be gladly corrected 
upon due notice being given to the 
editor personally at the office at 110 
East Texas St., Wheeler, Texas. 

THE WHEELER TIMES 
J. M. Montgomery, Sec'y. 

Box 675 
Members Urged To Attend. 

Visit-Ts We'corne -Shorter, itnin 	Ineetkhsp and 

FOR SALE: 14 x 70, 2 
bedroom, 2 bath mobile 
home. Good condition, 
54,500. Call 826-5737 or 
826-3739 after 2:00 p.m. 

HUNTING LEASE WANT-
ED within 150 miles of 
Amarillo. Any size acreage. 
We are safe and responsible 
hunters. References avail-
able. Call Mike 9-5, (806) 
376-7056; after 6, 359-1503. WHEELER 

REDI-MIX 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 	 
Phone: 826-5515 la, calf 
Wheeler. "lexas 

Allison 	From Page 3  L 
Harrington-Choatie Family reunion 
over near Cheyenne, Okla. over the 
weekend. Reported a good time and 
lots of good food. 

Ona Black„ Henry and Cheryl 
Dupont and Sabrina returned home 
last Sunday evening from spending 
about ten days at Muskogee. Ona's 
sister Lola Stone is in the hospital at 
Muskogee. Has been pretty sick. Ona 
visited Her several times while there. 
Ona's nephew, Frances and wife 
Jeananne Reed from Dallas met Ona, 
Henry and Cheryl and baby on their 
way home to Dallas and the others on 
their way home to Allison so they 
stopped at McDonald's in Elk City 
before coming on home. 

Keith and Ann Boydston, Natalie 
and Jessica went to Amarillo through 
the fourth of July weekend and visited 
with Rodney and Linda Ingersoll and 
Andrew and stayed until Wednesday, 
Tuesday they all attended the (Drama) 
Texas at the Palo Duro Canyon. 
Natalie stayed over in Amarillo until 
Friday. Becky brought her to Pampa 
where they met Keith and they came 
•-•.1 home. 

WANTED PART TIME 
HELP for the personal care 
of elderly couple, live in 
Shamrock. Call 826-3629 for 
information. 

Monroe and Nadine Reynolds 
weekend guests were Wayne and 
Debbie Reynolds and family from 
Amarillo and also Sunday dinner 
guest were Gary and Linda Hall, 
Kevin and Kim, Bennie and Debbie 
Boydston, Heather and Jason. 

(Note): You know you're grown up 
when you no longer have things stored 
at your parents home. 

The Wheeler Times does not know-
ingly accept false or fraudulent 
advertsing or other advertising of an 
objectional nature, is printed In full 
confidence in the presentation 
made. Readers will confer a favor if 
they will promptly report any failure 
on the part of the advertiser to make 
good any misrepresentation in our 
kdvertisements. 

Saturday night Keith and Ann and 
girls, J.R. and Leota Black went to 
Maxey's Steakhouse at Wheeler and 
had supper together. 

Roy and Lanora Morse, Dick and 
Cletus Greene and Jamie were supper 
guest last Saturday evening at Vance 
and Caroline Boydston's and Kyles. 

Roy Green spent last week at 
Lubbock with Kevin Boydston, re-
turned home last Monday. 

CLASSIFIED 
RATES: 

REDI-MIX CONCRETE 
SAND 

Washed Gravel-All Sizes 

Office Hours:7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 Elk City Community Hospital 
WANT TO BUY: Used 13.6 
x 28 tractor tires, 826-3257 
or 826-5525. 

The Times perfers all 
classified ads be paid in 
advance, except for open 
ledger account customers. 

Cash and Ledger ac-
count: 15c word; $1.50 
minimum. (Ad paid when 
place or by 5:00 p.m. 
Wednesday of week ad 
runs.) 
Charge: 20c word; $2.00 
minimum. 

Card of Thanks ... $3.75 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds: Noon Tues. 
Display: Noon Tuesday. 

PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 
Houses or Land 

Paul Topper 
200 S. Canadian St. 

FOR SALE: 54 yards of 
carpet, good condition. Can 
see on the floor at Evelyn 
Meek's home. 375-2396. 

Another very impressive aspect of 
the Holier Monitor system is that the 
physician will have test results the 	V 
same day or the next day; whereas, in 
the past it took approximately 7-10 
days for test results. 

This new $23,000 Holter Monitor 
System will enable the physician and 
the technician to make decisions 
based upon the cardiac rhythm they 
view and deteci in a faster and more 
efficient manner. 

Wheeler, Tx. Alutru num 
Self-Storing 

Community Hospital has recently 
purchased a new holter monitor 
system for use by the cardio-pulmon-
ary department to monitor a patient's 
heart while the patient is involved in 
his normal every-day acitivities. This 
will provide a more accurate picture of 
the amount of stress placed on the 
heart during a regular day. In the 
past, patients were hospitalized and 
were placed on the heart monitor. 
Now patients can be monitored at 
home and this system has the capa-
bilities of monitoring three patients at 
the same time. 

FOR SALE: Nice older 
piano. Sounds good, 
826-3104. STORM-SCREEN 

WINDOWS 
Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable From inside. Easy tc  
Clean..prowler-proof. Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills.... 

WHEELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 	Wheeler, Tex.  

CITY DUMP 
GROUND HOURS 

Monday, Tuesday 
Wednesday, Thursday. 

Friday. Saturday 
8:30 A.M. til 5:30 P.M. 

FOR SALE: Sheltie Puppies, 
little lassies. AKC Reg. 
Tri-colored, 2 females. 1 
male, 6 wks. old, July 18th, 
$100 ea. Wheeler, TX. Ph. 
826-3006. 

Hot vinegar can be used to re-
move decals and freshly dried paint 
from windows and cupboards. 



Happy Birthday to Rex Helton, 
Margie Meadows and Angie Louder 
on July 10, Sara Powledge, Billy 
Harden, Jimmy Nelson, Roy Waters 
and Jocelyn Brown on July 12, Bob 
Ratliff and Rachel Reynolds on July 
15, Wilma Bible, Joe Wagoner and 
Jeana Jones on July 16. 

Happy Anniversary to Walter and 
Wilma Bible on July 10, Royce and 
Deedy Zybach, R.L. and Rozena 
Zybach, Kenneth and Lou Dean 
Douthit on July 15, Wayne and Pat 
Childress and Aaron and Claudetta 
Laverty on July 16. 

As Independence Day rolls around, 
it makes us think of how thankful we 
ought to be to live in this free country. 
Most of the people in the world would 
like to live here. How much our nation 
and leaders need our prayers. It can 
not survive unless we turn back to God 
and get on a more secure financial and 
spiritual level. 

Mac and Patty Sheilds went to 
Pampa Tuesday night and ate out and 
shopped some to celebrate their 22nd 
wedding anniversary. Nice to have 
them come by and visit us a little 
while. 

Some of the Briscoe High School 
4 

	

	girls involved in summer basketball at 
Kelton on Tuesday nights are Mandy 
Ferguson, Shellie and Christina Ogle, 
Nikki Scott, Lori Purcell, Tammy 
Hat-well and Tina Lehman. 

There was a very good singing at 
Gageby Church Sunday night with 
Lois Meadows in charge. Some sing-
ing were Ray Forbes, Winnie, Tonya 
Gilmer, Laura and Amy Meadows, 
Lajuana and Kulani McElroy, Evelyn, 
Lois and Martha Meek, Jana and 
Bridgett Chandler, Katie and Sarah 
Cornell, Winnie and Tonya Gilmer 
and Rita Pearson, Linda Kelly, 
Francis Hickman, also Willa fillingim 
read poems and Willis played the 
harmonica. 

Laverty's will be in charge first 
Sunday in August. Aaron and Canon 
put on a cute skit. 

Boyce, Londa and Terri Crownover 
spent a few days with Bess and Frank 
Crownover at Canyon. 

Wednesday Evelyn Meek met 
Kathy Meek in Amarillo and they 
shopped. Evelyn spent the night with 
Kathy and had lunch Thursday with 
cousins, Earl and Louise Wallace. 
Others there were Jean Pollack, 
Wayne and Mabel Roper, Earla Jean 
and Lacey Morris. Evelyn brought 
Jean Pollack back to Wheeler to 
Jewell Holloman's. 

Sunday Evelyn Meek and Jean 
Pollack and Jewell Holloman attended 
the 45th wedding anniversary celebra-
tion at the Temple Baptist Church in 
Amarilo for Earl and Louise Wallace. 
Visiting Evelyn after church Sunday 
night were Kathy Meek and Kim 
Coleman. 

Gaye Hale and family visited Bernie 

11-1E WHEELER TIMES 
^Sheeler. inn of friend.hip unit pride." 

Tapp and family north of Amarillo 
Thursday. 

Tim Bennett has been helping 
Thurman Horn with farming. Tim and 
Lisa and Jimmy and Patrick left 
Saturday to go visit Tim's parents at 
Durant, Oklahoma for a few days. 
They planned to camp out by a creek 
on their place. Billy Harden was to 
meet them there. Hope the weather 
was nice. 

Bob and Sue Ratliff and Melody, 
Mandy and Keith and Kevin and Pam 
Ratliff left very early Friday morning 
to go on a camping vacation to 
Colorado mountains. Got back late 
Monday night. 

Willis and I, Heather Ratliff, Karla 
Murray and Claudetta Laverty went to 
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YOU 	 Lawn chairs 
50 	Shade Tree Pickin 

.000.1 

FRIDAY - 6,00 PM to MIDNIGHT 
SATURDAY • 2.00 PM to 6:00 nt 

6,00 PM to 7100 PM DINNER HUAI 
7:00 PM to 12.00 MIDNIGHT 

SUNDAY • 10,00 Alt to 12.00 NOON 

: DAY PASS, 	$10.00 
FRIDAY NIGHT, SS.00 

SATURDAY ALL DAY, $7.00 
AFTER 5,00 P.M.; $S.00 

SUNDAY FREE I 	' 
CHILDREN 12 	 ran 

FOR TICKET INFORMATION, 

(ROb) )53•70‘1 or 311I*2447 

P 0 SIMILE 
NO ALCOHOL OR DRUGS 

CONCESSIONS 
FURNISHED RY OLD NObLLrlt 
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to watch. 
Psalm 34:17 The righteous cry, and 

the Lord hears and delivers them out 
of all their troubles. 

Don and Cindy Hartsfield and 
Haydon of Amarillo visited J.P. and 
Martha Meek a few days and helped 
can apricots, trim trees and visit. 

Shawn Everett has been visiting his 
dad and grandmother and other 
relatives at Muleshoe. 

Nice to see Paul Luttrell in the 
grocery store at Wheeler Thursday. 
We graduated from dear old Briscoe 
High in 1938. He has not been very 
well for a few years. He's a brother to 
Lou Dean Douthit. Remember him in 
your prayers. 

Nice to have William and Vickey 
Cornell and family spend Sunday 
night with us and go to church 
at Gageby. They also visited Bob and 
Mary Cornell and Anthony and Judy 
Cornell for family get-togethers. 
Vickey graduated from a nurses' aide 
course at Burns Flats Saturday and 
hopes to start work soon at Cordell. 
William and Vickey and family also 
visited Brad and Sue Chandler and 
girls. 

Sunday dinner guests at the home 
of Roy and Lois Meadows were 
Winnie Gilmer, and Tonya, Julie and 
Davy and Gaye Hale and Elizabeth, 
David and Sarah. 

Bob and Becky Blackburn and 
family were going to Wheeler Monday 
night to the dance and fireworks. 

Willis and I enjoyed going to the 
parade in Canadian Monday and to 
the Old-Settlers reunion at City Hall. 
Dayla (Hash) Johnson, of Allison as 
last years Rodeo Queen, led the 
parade and also the Grand Entry at 
the Rodeo. Good to see old friends 
from Willis High School days and 
others. Howard and Katherine 
Yarnold, Homer and Margaret 
Sanders, Bryan and Bertha Eckles, 
Roy (Aldo) and Evelyn Dickinson, 
Grace Haines, Jesse and Jonilyn 
Hanes and Morgan and Spencer, 
Mary Lee and Bud Hoobler, Clara 
Helen Cole, Julia Williams and many 
more! 

Enjoying a weekend camp out at 
Foss Lake were Dick and Ruth Irvine, 
Rick and Connie Irvine, Zachary Tipps 
and Grace Irvine. Ruth is taking some 
college courses this summer. 

Remember Mary Lea Hoobler in 
your prayers. She has Lupers. And 
Margaret Sanders has colon trouble, 
remember her. 

Tim Bennett's mom, Patricia 
Bennett, had an article published in 
Dallas Life Magazine for June 26, 
about early married life on the farm. 
She spoke of very hard work and how 
hard it was for a city girl to cope and 
fit in, about helping pull calves, drive 
tractors, haul hay and raise 4 little 
blond boys on the side. I could really 
relate as I've never been a very 
efficient farmer. Very interesting 
article. 

The Briscoe Junior High and High 
School Cheerleaders are sponsoring a 
Girls Softball Round Robin tourna-
ment at Briscoe Saturday, July 16, all 
day from 8:30 a.m. They will be 
serving hamburgers and French fries 
and cold drinks, etc. in the school 
cafeteria. So bring your lawn chairs 
and sit in the shade and watch them 
play and eat with them. They are 
trying to make money to go to 
cheerleader camp at Plainview. High 
School Cheerleaders are Mandy Fer-
guson, Shellie Ogle, Nikki Scott and 
Christina Ogle. Jr. High girls are Amy 
Van Vranken, Shelly Hunt, and Jamie 
Trimble. 

Larry and Vickey Nelson and family 
spent the 4th of July at the home of 
Earl and Shirley Jolly in Wheeler for a 
family get together. 

Lajuana McElroy spent the 4th of 
July with Laura Lee Norris. They went 
to the parade, rodeo and fireworks 
and had lunch with Laura's grand-
mother, Agnes Adams in Canadian. 
LaJuana and Laura Lee have been 
good friends since early school days. 
Kulani McElroy spent the day with 
Casey Lyons in Canadian. They have 
also been friends for many years. 
They also went to the parade and 
rodeo. 

Happy Birthday to Patrick Bennett, 
on July 17, Gay Purcell on July 18, 
Larry Nelson, Rheann Watson, Ruby 
Cole, Pam Meadows and Sammie 
Atherton on July 21, Tina Sides and 
Reagan Meadows on July 22. 

Happy Anniversary to Dennis and 
Peggy Thompson on July 17, Elbert 
and Ruby Zybach on July 21, and 
Kevin and Jana Meek on July 23. 

Mac and Patty Sheilds and Amy, 
Amanda and Kevin were supper 
guests July 4th in the home of Johnny 
and Cindy Grayson and Jerome and 
Keri. Others there were Bo and 
Brenda Keys and Lindsey and Jared, 
Dean and Karen Keys and family, 
Leonard, Jr. and Teresa Powledge 
and Jody and Sara, Buster and Irene 
Keys of Shamrock. Boyd and Ellen 
Huff and Clint, Dan and Walker, 
Johnny and Angie Huff and children. 
They played music and had fireworks 
and visited. 

Tuesday night there was a weiner 
roast at the home of Butch and Jada 
Murray and children. Butch's sister 

Ann from Beloit, Wisconsin has been 
visiting here. Others present were 
another sister, Carolyn Ehman and 
Christina, Shawn and Amber of 
Miami and Ed Trimble. 

Shelly Murray has been doing 
better since surgery and allergy shots. 
She hears lots better and is gaining a 
little weight. Keep praying for her and 
her family. 

Karla. Shelly, and Buddy Murray got 
to ride on the "Hard Times" float in 
the parade at Canadian on the 4th of 
July. Butch and children also visited 
his aunt, Louise Wilson. Others there 
were his sisters Ann of Wisconsin, 
Carolyn Ehman, Susan Bayne and 
Dora and Levi of Fort Worth, Tonya 
White and Roy Wilson. When Jada 

Continued Page 7 

Fiftieth Anniversary 

Panfork 	Baptist 	Camp 

Wednesday night to services and 
supper. Really enjoyed it. 

Heather Ratliff spent Wednesday 
night with Karla Murray. Jada took 
them all swimming Thursday. Jada 
dives beautifully. 

Tonya and Julie Gilmer have been 
staying some with Florence George at 
her home. 

Frank and Bess Crownover from 
Canyon visited and ate lunch with 
Charles and Lajo Crownover and 
family Tuesday to celebrate Terri's 
6th birthday. Others there later for ice 
cream and cake were Willa Fillingim, 
Tamitha Francis, Keith Ratliff, Boyce, 
Jodie and Londa Crownover. They 
played in the creek and had fun. 

Andrea Hershenrader from Dallas 
has been visiting her cousins, Shellie 
and Christina Ogle. They all visited 
Willa Fillingim and Melody Ratliff. 
Visiting us were Andrea, Shellie, 
Christina, Melody and Mandy Tues. 
Jana and Bridget Chandler and Carrie 
and William Zumstein also visited us. 

We enjoyed going to see Briscoe 
Pee Wee's baseball team play 
Wheeler Astros Thursday night. Bris-
coe won, but it was a good game. 
Hard to believe how well those tiny 
kids play. Wayne and Cathy Zybach 
and Brenda and Dennis Hefley have 
worked hard with them. Everyone was 
having fun. We got to watch some of 
the girls Briscoe vs Miami Softball 
game, but it was rained out. Lots of 
parents and grandparents and others 

Dr. Jack L. Rose 
OPTOMETRIST 

121 Main St.---Shamrock 
Phone: 256-3203 

Tues.: 9-5 	 Fri.: 2-5 

SPARLIN'S RESTAURANT 
East Hwy 152 	 Wheeler, Texas 

Salad Bar Open Daily till 8:30 
MR. AND MRS. VALENTINE BENAVIDEZ 

Valentine and Maria Benavidez 
celebrated their 50th anniversary 
Sunday, July 10, at a reception held in 
the garden at the couples home. 
Hosted by their children and grand-
children; Mr. and Mrs. Ruben Bena-
videz, Richard, Renee, Rosana and 
Ruby from Dallas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Valentine Benavidez, Jr. and family, 
from Hollis, OK.; Dwight, Susie and 
Larry Erwin from Wheeler; Diana 
Hudson and Jessica from Watonga, 
OK., Robert Deluna, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raul Benavidez, Sandy, Donna, Raul, 
Jr., Melinda and Justin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Juan Benavidez, Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Merrilot, Augie Steve, Jr. and 
Wayne, Noe Martinez, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gray Thorton, Allen, Andy and Adam 
all from Erick. 

The couple renewed their wedding 
vows in a simple garden setting. The 

Every Wednesday: 

Hickory Smoked Pit Barbecue 
Ribs or Beef 	(Carry out Available) 

granddaughters decorated the recep-
tion table with a blue lace table cloth, 
blue and gold candles and a floral 
arrangement, a 3 tiered cake, nuts 
and mints and punch completed the 
table decorations. The granddaugh-
ters served the refreshments to the 
couple and to the guests. 

Mrs. Madge Erwin attended from 
Wheeler, Mark Westfall from 
Watonga, OK; David Valedez from 
Hollis, OK. 

The couple were married July 10, 
1938 in San Diego, Texas and had six 
children, 31 grandchildren and 16 
great grandchildren. One daughter 
Lydia Benavidez Martinez died in 
1980. 

They were residents of Wheeler for 
10 years then moved to Erick where 
they have lived for 20 years. 

Every Friday: 

Fresh Water Catfish 
Everyday Prices: 

8 oz. Sirloin 

)

All with 

choice of 
potatoes, 	, 

Salad & Roll 
16 oz. Sirloin 

4.95 
6.95 
5.95 8 oz. Ribeye 

Phone: 826-9923 
Dining Room available 

REPORT OF CONDITION Come To The 

Panhandle 
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Old Tyme Music 

Association's 

Consolidating domestic and foreign subsidiaries of the 
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FIRST NATIONAL BANK IN WHEELER 
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In the state of 	TEXAS 	at the close ot business on 	JUNE 30 	1988 
published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12, United States Code. Section 161.  
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Statement of Resources and Liabilities 

Thousands of dollars 
8th ANNUAL BLUEGRASS FESTIVAL 

July 22, 23 & 24, 1988 
Featuring 

WEST TEXAS RANCH HANDS SMITH FAMILY GOSPEL 
NOW & THEN 

TRI-STATE BLUEGRASS EXPRESS 
SOUTHERN EXPRESS 	KNEE DEEP IN BLUEGRASS 

BURK BROS. & SHERMAN 	JACK SELBY & FAMILY 
CHARLIE & KIWI HUTCHINSON & BILL MURRY 

THE PLAINSMEN 
TOP OF TEXAS CLOGGERS 

AND MANY MORE!!! 

Old Mobeetie, Texas 
s 	Old Mobeetie Jail Museum 

25 1711184 east of Pampa on Hwy. 152 or 11 miles west of Wheeler 

21.236 

1,085 
1.000  

3.925 

Cash and balances due from depository institutions 
Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin 
Interest-bearing balances 

Securities 	  
Federal funds sold 	  
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 	  
Loans and lease financing receivables: 

Loans and leases, net of unearned income. 
LESS: Allowance for loan and lease losses .. 
LESS. Allocated transfer risk reserve ......... 
Loans and leases, net of uneamild income, allowance, and reserve . 

Assets held in trading accounts 	  
Premises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases).. 
Other real estate owned . 	• . 	........ 
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies 
Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding.. . 
Intangible assets 	  
Other assets 	  
Total assets 	  
Losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823(j) 	  

_Total assets and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S C 1823(j) 

Deposits: 
In domestic offices 	  

Noninterest-beanng 	  
Interest-bearing 	  

Federal funds purchased 	  
Securities sold under agreements to repurchase 	  
Demand notes issued to the U.S Treasury 
Other borrowed money 
Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases 
Bank's liability on acceptances executed and outstanding 
Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits 
Other liabilities 
Total liabilities 
Limitedlife preferred stock 

0 

9.478 
195 

9,083 
0 

366 
0  

693 
• 17.388  Rain z7

or 

on 152 

37.388 

29.524 

Camping In The Rough 
Limited Hook Ups Available 

0 
0 
0  

0 

313 
29.839 

0 

Perpetual preferred stock.. 
Common stock 	 
Surplus .. 
Undivided profits and capital reserves. 	. 
Total equity capital 	  
Losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 182301 	 
Total equity capital and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823(.0 
Total liabilities, limited-life preferred stock, equity capital, and losses 

deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823(11 . 

0 
114 
368 

SALE CONTINUES 
Entire Stock Reduced 

-Big Savings- 
Sidewalk Sale Saturday 

The Ladies Store 
211 N. Main 	Shamrock, Texas 	'56-2251 

7.067  
7 54o 

0 
7.549  

31,3b8 

ADRIAN R RI SHER VVe,theundersigneddirectipes attest to the correctness ea,  
thisstatementotreSourcesandliabilihes Viedectarethalit 
has been examined by us. and to the best of our kncrwiedge 
and belief has been pre.. 	in conformance with the 
instwcbens and is t 	a 	ect 

Wow 

VICE PRES) DENT 	CASHI ER  

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this Resort 
of Condilton is true and Cared to the best 01 my knowledge 
and belief 

Listen  to . . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
Directors 

\% heeler. Texa,. 



critteo from 

t: 	 Cl

Linda Doughiry, CEA 
a (Home Economics) 
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APPOINTMENT OF ELECTION 

Elmer Ray Harrison made a motion 
which was seconded by Boyd Hilt-
brunner to appoint the following 

JUDGES FOR 1988-1989: 

election judges and assistants to hold 
county elections. This is for the term 
of 1988-1989. Motion carried unani-
mously. 

VOTING BOX NO. 
Mobectic 	I 
Wheeler 	2 
Wheeler (Stanley) 3 
Allison 	 4 
Lela 	 6 
Twins 	 7 
Shamrock (West) 8 
Shamrock (East) 9 
Briscoe 	10 
Absentee 

LOCATION 
First State Bank 
Senior Citizens Bldg. 
Commissioners Ct. Room 
Allison School 
Lela School 
Lucille King Home 
City Hall 
Shamrock Jr. Hi. Gym 
Briscoe School 
County Clerk's Office 

JUDGE 
l'aul Hathaway 
Jane Thomas 
David Britt 
Dwight Tipps 
Dale Wells 
Lucille King 

M.L. Gierhart 
James Baxter 
Debbie Kinnaman 
Audrey Pearce 

ASSISTANT 
JUDGE 

Jim Batton 
Nelda Miley 
Agatha Johnson 
Teresa Dyer 
Richard Porter 

Helfey 
Shirley Galmor 
Dorothy Vearner 
Bobbye Horn 
Rodney Barker 

••••••••••irlsor 	 

TJHA Pullen, Rockwall, director; Johnna 
Hay, Justin, secretary; Jessica Oman, 
Avoca, second vice-president; Faye 
Mulling), Rochester, first vice-presi-
dent; Connie Brandenberger, Llano, 
director; Terri Barber, Channing, 
parliamentarian; and Sandra Cope-
land, Mountainair, NM., American 
Junior Hereford Assocation director. 
(Photo by American Hereford Associ-
ation). 

per month until he has recertified as 
an EMT, then raised $50.00 per 
month. Motion carried. 
DELINQUENT TAX ROLL FOR 1987 
APPROVED: 

Elmer Ray Harrison made a 
motion which was seconded by Clois 
Hanner to approve the delinquent tax 
roll for Wheeler County in the total 
amount of $48,639.64. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

A copy of this roll is on file in the 
Tax Collectors office for public 
inspection. 
REFUND OF OVERPAYMENT OF 
TAXES: 

Sibyl Willis Burrows 
Boyd Hiltbrunner made a motion 

which was seconded by Billie V. 
Atherton to send a refund check in the 
amount of $895.21 to Sibyl Willis 
Burrows for overpayment of taxes to 
the county. Motion carried. 

BOARD OF DIRECTORS: 
Texas Junior Hereford Assocation 
members recently held an exciting 
field day featuring educational and 
motivational activities along side the 
$2,500 Lone Star State Regional 
Junior Hereford Classic. David Here-
ford Ranch, Wheeler, hosted the 
junior organization's annual event. 

TJHA board of directors involved in 
the continued success of this youth 

organization include, in the front row 
left to right, Sam Davidson, Gustine, 
junior director; Kathalcen Ford, 
Clyde, former president; Calvin 
Gunter, Rogers, treasurer; Marci 
McKinzie, Dike, reporter; and Judith 
Oman, Avoca, director. Standing, left 
to right, are Nacy Davis, Wheeler, 
Junior director; Stewart Davidson, 
Gustine, junior director; Marty 
McKinzie, Dike, president; Lucinda 

July 11, 1988 
The Wheeler County Commission. 

ers Court met in Regular Session with 
Judge Wendell Morgan presiding. 
Members present were: Elmer Ray 
Harrison, Billie V. Atherton, Clois 
Harmer and Boyd Hiltbrunner, 
Commissioners precincts I, 2, 3, and 
4, respectively. Also present were 
Margaret Dorman, County Clerk, M. 
Kent Sims, County Attorney, Ron 
Gowdy, County Auditor, Jerry Bob 
Jernigan, Constable and Lonnie 
Miller, Sheriff. 

Court was opened with a prayer 
offered by Clois Hanner. 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES: 

Billie V. Atherton made a motion 
which was w seconded by Boyd 
Hiltbrunner to approve the minutes of 
the June 13th and June 27th, 1988 
court meetings as written. Motion 
carried unanimously. 
APPROVAL OF BILLS: 

Elmer Ray Harrison made a motion 
which was seconded by Boyd Hilt-
brunner to pay the bills as approved 
for payment and found listed in 
Volume 9 page 511 of the Minutes of 
Accounts Allowed in the County 
Clerks office. Motion carried unanim-
ously. 
APPROVAL OF JUSTICE OF PEACE 
ROBERTS: 

Boyd Hiltbrunner made a motion 
which was seconded by Elmer Ray 
Harrison to approve the following 
Justice of the Peace reports for the 
month 	of 	June: 	Doyle 
Ramsey—$1,0 74.5 0; Herbert 
S tacy —$3 , 452 . 50; 	and 	Lee 
Bond—$5,660.50. Motion carried 

unanimously. 
ADOPTION OF BUDGET FOR 
10-1-88 to 9-30-89: 

Elmer Ray Harrison made a motion 
which was seconded by Clois Hanner 
to approve the proposed budget for 
the term of October 1, 1988 through 
September 30, 1989. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

A copy of this budget is on file in 
the Couty Clerk's office for public 
inspection. 

GEORGE HOOTEN HIRED AS 
AMBULANCE CO-ORDINATOR-
SOUTH WHEELER COUNTY: 

Boyd Hiltbrunner made a motion 
which was seconded by Clois Hanner 
to hire George Hooten to serve as 
ambulance co-ordinator for the south 
Wheeler County service, effective 
July 16, 1988. Carried. 

Elmer Ray Harrison made a motion 
which was seconded by Boyd Hilt-
brunner to set his salary at $1,358.00 

Second, it hasn't been shown that 
just because two ounces of oats are 
effective in lowering cholesterol levels 
that more than two ounces will be 
even better. So don't go overboard on 
oats to the exclusion of other carbohy-
drates. 

Also avoid coconut and palm oils. 
They're not the same as other 
vegetable oils because they are 
saturated and can raise blood choles-
terol levels. These fats are typically 
found in dairy products. So read the 
labels carefully. 
Where Does Cholesterol Come From 

The body produces about 80 percent 
of the total cholesterol found in the 
blood and tissues. The other 20 
percent is furnished by dietary 
sources. The amount of saturated fat 
and cholesterol in the diet determine 
how much cholesterol is in the 
bloodstream. 
Try Oats To Reduce Cholesterol Level 

Clarence & Ether Dyson 
66th Wedding Anni. 

It's long been known that the fiber 
in oats lowers blood cholesterol in 
people who have high levels, thus 
reducing their risk of developing heart 
disease. Now researchers have also 
found it lowers Blood cholesterol of 
people who have what are considered 
normal levels. 

Research scientists at Northwestern 
University School of Medicine have 
found that just two ounces a day of 
either oatmeal or oat bran, which 
equals about two cups of hot cereal or 
two muffins, can lower cholesterol by 
almost 5 percent in a matter of weeks. 

Before you start eating bowl upon 
bowl of oatmeal be aware of two 
factors. First, the oat products in the 
studies found to be helpful only as 
part of a moderate-fat, moderate-
cholesterol diet. So don't count on 
oatmeal to combat the effects of a 
fatty diet. 

4) 

Host Needed For 
Exchange Students 

FATS TO EAT AND FATS TO AVOID 
Confused about which fats to cat 

and which to avoid if you're trying to 
lower your cholesterol level? Here's a 
guide: 

Eat good fats such as olive oil and 
peanut oil. Heart rates are very low in 
countries where people cook with 
these monounsaturated oils. Research 
studies have shown that olive oil helps 
reduce blood cholesterol levels. 

Or use other vegetable oils. These 
include cottonseed. safflower, corn, 
soybean and sunflower oils. They are 
known as polyuniaturated and will 
also help reduce blood cholesterol 
levels. 

The kinds of fat you want to avoid 
come from animal products. Meat and 
poultry, for example, are very nutrit-
ious foods, but eat the lean, not the 
fat. Trim all visible fat from meat and 
poultry and buy cuts that are labeled 
lean. Also choose low-fat dairy pro-
ducts. 

The 66th Wedding anniversary of 
Clarence and Ether Lee Dyson was 
celebrated in the home of R. H. and 
Betty Dyson on July 4th. 

Those attending were: Clarence and 
Ether Lee Dyson, R. H. and Betty 
Dyson, Lee and Diane Waters and 
family, Kent and Cheryl Dyson and 
daughter, Ronnie and Brenda Dyson 
and daughter, Jerry and Linda Dyson, 
Debbie Dyson, Roy, Bobbye and 
Bobby Roy Dyson, Bud and Verue 
Voiles, all of Pampa, Bill and Shirley 
Dyson, Mobeetie, Richard and Helen 
Dyson and Stacey Berry of Sayre, 
Oklahoma, Sue Zybach of Oklahoma 
City, Roy and Helen Conner of 
Denver, Colorado, and Blake Nipper 
of Houston. Lots of food, cake, and 
home made ice cream was enjoyed by 
all. 

ere Pi 	ere 
Postal Exams Are 
Being Offered 

DAVIS HEREFORD RANCH HOSTS 
FIELD DAY AND $2,500 LONE STAR 
STATE REGIONAL JUNIOR 
HEREFORD CLASSIC: Over 200 
people braved the hot, dry weather 

ik 

Wheeler 

Public Library 

conditions to attend the Texas Junior 
Hereford Association Field Day and 
$2,500 Lone Star State Regional 
Junior Hereford Classic hosted by 
Davis Hereford Ranch, Wheeler. 
Marty McKinzie, left, Dike, TJHA 
president, is pictured presenting 
Champ, center, and George Davis a 
gift expressing the TJHA member-
ship's appreciation for the Davis 
Family's continuing support of Texas 
youth involved in the beef cattle and 
Hereford industries. (Photo by Amer-
ican Hereford Association). 

New Caretaker For 
Mobeetie Museum 

Donald S. Bloyd, Sectional Cen-
ter Manager/Postmaster, Lubbock, 
Tx has announced that the Rural 
Carrier examination for Lubbock, TX 
will be open from July 25, 1988 
through July 29, 1988. 

Persons who are interested may 
apply at their local Post Office during 
this week. No applications will be 
accepted prior to or after these dates. 

Starting salary for Rural Carrier 
positions is $19,428 per year. 

Donald S. Bloyd, Sectional Center 
Manager/Postmaster, Lubbock, Tx 
has announced that the Rural Carrier 
examination for the Crosbyton, TX 
Area will be open from July 25, 1988 
through July 29, 1988. 

This examination will be used to fill 
vacancies in the following cities: 
Crosbyton, Floydata, Idalou, Lockney, 
Lorenzo, Petersburg, Post, Rails, 
Slaton, Spur, and Wilson. 

Persons who are interested may 
apply at the local Post Office during 
this week. No applications will be 
accepted prior to or after these dates. 

Starting salary for Rural Carrier 
positions is $19,428 per year. 

Donald S. Bloyd, Sectional Center 
Manager/Postmaster, Lubbock, TX 
has announced that the Distribution 
Clerk, Machine examination for the 
Amarillo, TX office will be open from 
July 25, 1988 through July 29, 1988. 

Persons who are interested may 
apply at their local Post Office during 
this week. No applications will be 
accepted prior to or after these dates. 

Starting salary for Distribution 
Clerk, Machine positions is $10.59 per 
hour. 

Mobeetie is very proud of the 
new caretaker, Alfred Cavanass, at 
the Old Museum and Jail. He has 
been working very hard and I have 
never seen the grounds more lovely. 

Our new caretaker is Alfred 
Cavanass. His wife is very pretty and 
named Ruby. 

They came to Mobeetie from 
Pampa. They have S children living all 
over the world. Mr. Cavanass is a 
retired minister and hopes to make 
living at his future loving and caring 
for the Museum when you come to the 
Blue Grass Festival. I'm sure you will 
enjoy meeting them and enjoy seeing 
how lovely he has the grounds. See 
you at the Blue Grass Festival. 

The pads on a fly's feet secrete a 
sticky substance that enable it to 
cling to almost any surface—even 
run upside down along a ceiling. 

Every year, foreign visitors spend 
about $14 billion in the U.S. 

Don't Line Dry Whites 
Now that summer's here you may 

want to hang out some white clothes 
to line dry. However, the International 
Fabric Care Institute doesn't recom-
mend this procedure because most 
white fabrics contain optical brighten-
ers. Many brighteners are unstable to 
sunlight, and a few hours in the sun 
can cause drastic and permanent 
yellowing. The yellowing has been 
known to develop in as little as 30.60 
minutes when a garment is exposed to 
direct sunlight. 

Imagine begin able to absorb the 
culture of a foreign country for a 
whole year without ever having to 
leave home. That's exactly what the 
ASSE Student Exchange Program 
offers local families who want to host 
an outstanding teenager from abroad. 

Having an European or Australian 
youngster become part of the family 
for an academic year gives everyone 
in the house the opportunity to learn 
more about themselves and the world 
they live in. 

ASSE teenagers are outstanding 
students from Europe, Australia and 
all points in-between. They're moti-
vated 15-18 year olds who want to 
become part of an American house-
hold, which means they pitch in on 
everything from chores to family 
discussions. They're also enthusiastic 
about sharing the culture and customs 
of their own homeland. And although 
most ASSE kids are fluent in English, 
they love to help teach their own 
language to their American family. 
And what better way to learn? 

Host families also gain a new 
perspective on their own way of life. 
Parents and kids alike come to 
appreciate lots of things they've 
probably taken for granted. Like all 
the TV channels they have to choose 
from (not to mention MTV) plus all the 
great things to buy in our consumer 
wonderland. 

The ASSE exchange program only 
lasts ten months but host families 
discover the special relationships they 
build go on forever. "I have a 
daughter from Finland, a daughter 
from Germany, and a son from 
Sweden. Two daughters and a son, 
plus three whole new families we get 
to visit when we go overseas." (Guinn 
Sweet, Weatherford, Texas.) "From 
our one ASSE exchange student we 
got a whole new family overseas." 
(Kim Kimberly, New Orleans, Lou-
isiana.) 

And it's reassuring to know that the 
ASSE Program is affiliated with the 
most esteemed government education 
departments in the world: the 
National Swedish and Finnish De-
partments of Education, The Cana-
dian Provincial Ministries of Educa-
tion and the Australian and New 
Zealand Departments of Education, 
have approved the ASSE program. 
and the United States information 
Agency has officially designated 
ASSE as an exchange visitor program. 
If you want to give your family a 
foreign accent for a year and even a 
lifetime, contact ASSE Area Coordin-
ator: Ingalill Toles, 415 Azle Highway. 
Weatherford, TX 76086. CALL 
COLLECT: 817/599-0686. 

NORTH WHEELER COUNTY 
LITTLE LEAGUE 

On June 2, 1988 Kelton came to 
Briscoe. Kelton won by the score of 13 
to 4. Leading hitters were John 
Moffett and Ty Ferguson. David Hale 
was the pitcher. 

On June 6, 1988 N.W.C. went to 
Wheeler to play Wheeler 3. N.W.C. 
won the game 11 to 9. Leading hitters 
were Jake Swigart, John Moffett, 
Zach Mabry, Collin McCurley, Travis 
Stevens, and Jerome Grayson. 
Pitchers were David Hale and Jake 
Swigart. 

On June 9, 1988 Miami came to 
Briscoe. N.W.C. came away with the 
victory by the score of 9 to 4. Home 
run hitter was Jake Swigart. Other 
hitters were Ty Ferguson, John 
Moffett, Zach Mabry, Kaleb Meek 
and Jerome Grayson. Pitchers were 
John Moffett and Jake Swigart. 

On June 13, 1988 Wheeler 1 came 
to Briscoe. N.W.C. came away with 
another victory by the score of 14 to 
11. Leading hitters were Jake Swigart, 
Ty Ferguson, John Moffett and Zach 
Mabry. Pitchers were Zach Mabry, Ty 
Ferguson and Jake Swigart. 

On June 16, 1988 Wheeler 2 came 
to Briscoe to play a double header. In 
the first game N.W.C. won by the 
score of 13 to 11. Grand slam hitter 
was Zach Mabry. Home run hitter was 
John Moffett. Other hitters were Jake 
Swigart, Ty Ferguson, and Travis 
Stevens. Pitchers were Jerome 
Grayson, John Moffett and Jake 
Swigart. N.W.C. was down by 2 runs 
in the last inning. Zach Mabry hit the 
grand slam to put them up by 2 to give 
them the victory. Way to go Zach! 

In the second game of the double 
header N.W.C. came away with 
another victory by the score of 13 to 9. 
Leading hitters were Jake Swigart, 
David Hale, Kaleb Meek, Jerome 
Grayson, Archie Summers, Zach 
Mabry, Ty Ferguson and Darren 
Remy. Pitchers were Ty Ferguson and 
Travis Stevens. 

On June 20, 1988 N.W.C. went to 
Kelton to play their last game of the 
season. Kelton-  won by the score of 
20-18. In the bottom of the 4th inning 
the score was 16 to 5 Kelton. N.W.C. 
never gave up and in the top of the 5th 
inning came back fighting with 2 
grand slams by John Moffett and Zach 
Mabry. Way to go guys! N.W.C. 
ended up with 13 runs putting them 
up by 2 runs. Kelton tied it up in the 
bottom of 5th. Kelton ended up 
bringing in 2 more runs in extra 
inning to win the game. Other hitters 
were Jake Swigart and David Hale. 
Pitchers were David Hale and Jake 
Swigart. 

Congratulations to Jake Swigart 
and John Moffett for making the 
Eastern Panhandle All Star Team. 

Coaches for N.W.C. are James 
Moffett, Jerry Mabry and Cecil 
Reynolds. Other players for N.W.C. 
are Jase Baker, Tim Mayfield, Shane 
Stribling, and Terry Whitely. N.W.C. 
is composed of Briscoe, Mobeetie and 
Allison. See you boys next year! 

By Laura Guthrie 
This week has been a turmoil. I've 

been "digging-out". I've been 
"squirrling" away treasures for 65 
years, (end of college days), 52 of it 
right here in this house. You would be 
surprised—(I am surprised) at what 
I'm finding—a memory book from 
college days. What a treasure! But 
who else would want to see it? But I 
am reminded of good friends of earlier 
years. Some of you have known a few 
of them. Della Kelly of Wheeler was a 
roommate, Douglas Carver, was the 
Pastor of First Baptist Church in 
Pampa (also lived in Wheeler) for 
many years. I found the name of 
Carroll Gunter in my book. He was a 
cousin of Terrell and Ab Gunter. I 
knew him a long time before I knew 
the Wheeler Gunters. His mother was 
a Garner, so she must have been an 
aunt of Nell Bradstreet. The world is 
small isn't it. 

We had a lovely surprise visit last 
Friday. My in-laws, Lamar and 
Georgia Guthrie, Hollis, Oklahoma, 
and Lilly Edmondson of Tipton drove 
over and stayed a few hours. We 
enjoyed them so much. 

Last week I forgot to mention that 
Mrs. Nettie Luttrell had been to a 
family reunion at Crockett, Texas. Her 
granddaughter, Cherry drove her to 
Walters, Okla. Her daughter, Mona 
Guinn was there, so the two of them 
drove on to Crockett and Cherry 
returned to Wheeler. Mona has been 
spending some time in Walters where 
her son Stanley Baker and family live. 
She has been looking after the house 
and family while Stanley has been on 
a mission trip to Wyoming. 

I'm concerned about several of my 
friends who are having problems now, 
and I do pray for better days for them. 
Included arc Alta Jean Davis, 
LaJaune Alexander, and Esther Hill. 

Our household has been rather 
quiet for several days. (Very quiet for 
me, because my hearing aid went 
out!) Melinda and Tim were here on 
the weekend. They and Lydia made a 
trip to Pampa on Saturday. 

I haven't gotten quite all the 
apricots in jars yet, but 1 think I will 
have them sealed up in a day or two. 
Can't let a one waste for we might not 
have any more for three or four years. 

There were 21 young people for 
our first day of summer reading 
program. 

Kindergarten-2nd from 2 to 3. 3rd 
grade-5th from 4-5. 

Three more Monday meetings July 
18th and 25th Aug. 1. 

-wpl- 
Call 826-5977 to recheck your book. 

Give us the name and the author of 
the book. 

-wpl- 
We have some new lease books. 

Lease book remain on the shelves for a 
few months. Then they are returned to 
the lease company. Some of the new 
lease books are: "Inheritance" by 
Judith Michael; "Last Princess" by 
Cynthia Freeman; "Alice" by Sara 
Flanigan; "Beginners Book of 
Dreams" by Elizabeth Benedict; 
"Deeds of the Disturber" by Eliza-
beth Peters; "Angel Fire" by Andrew 
Greeley; "Freaky Deaky" by Elmore 
Leonard; "Harrogate Secret" by 
Catherine Cookson; "Trial of 
Socrates" by I.F. Stone, "Bare 
Bones" by Stephen King's thoughts 
on terror. 

-wpl. 
We have some new children's 

books: "Did Comets Kill the Dino-
saurs" by Isaac Asimov; "Grandma. 
Felix. and the Mustapha Biscuit" by 
Victor Ambrus: "Edward Gets a Pet" 
by Michaela Morgan; "The Mystery 
of Pony Hallow" by Lynn Hall; 
"Mash" by James Rothaus; "Sea 
Monsters" by David Eldridge; "The 
Berinstain Bears—Trouble at School 
by Stan and Jan Berenstain; "The 
Berenstain Bears and the Bad Habit". 

Naomi Speck, Librarian 



Melissa Hampton and Heather and 
Bernice Hefley all visited Tuesday. 

Joy Webb from Miami visited on 
Wednesday. 
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Pampa July 5th, with Larry and Judy 
Parker and John Forbes and Alan 
Parker. 

Joe Kelley went to Perryton Thurs-
day and visited Dave and Sue Kemp. 

Peeler and Evelyn Haning visited 
Anna Belle and Ariza Corcoran over 
the fourth. "Il hrrIrr. IIII•ot of frit itil•hip litul pride: 

Charles and Cindy Jones, Lisa and 
Larry and Jeremy from Texaco visited 
their grandparents Rev. Ralph and 
Mary Hovey over the 4th of July. 

I sure was glad to find Ransom 
Carter had come home from the 
hospital on Saturday. Charlotte 
Coward visited him on Thursday. 

Court 
Records 

to Richard Easley et al 5-1-88 
ASSIGN—Kelton Partnership to 

Hawkins Oil & Gas, Inc. 5-6-88 
DT—Linda Jan Duncan to Connie 

T. Lambert 6-30-88 W70' Lots 22-24 
Blk G Park Add Wheeler 

DVL—Connie T. Lambert to Linda 
Jan Duncan 6-30-88 W70' Lots 22-24 
Blk G Park Add Wheeler 

SHERIFF D—J. M. Cody to City of 
Shamrock 7-5-88 Lot 2 Blk 46 
Shamrock 

SHERIFF D—Fred L. Jackson et al 
to Royce Cantrell 7-5-8 Lot 11 Blk 1 
High School Add Shamrock 

SHERIFF D—Marie Lister to City 
of Shamrock 7-5-88 Lots 16-30 Blk XL 
Shamrock 

SHERIFF D—J. F. Voyles to City of 
Shamrock 7-5-88 Lot 1 Blk 46 
Shamrock 

SHERIFF D—G. H. Henderson et 
al to City of Shamrock 7-5-88 Lot 8 Blk 
11 Pendleton Baxter Add Shamrock 

EXT D 	Fraley et a] to Bill 
Rains et ux 6-7-88 

DT—Bill Rains et ux to First State 
Bank of Mobeetie 6-26-88 

TDT—Bill Rains et ux to First State 
Bank of Mobeetie 6-26-88 

D—Armell Holt Brown et vir John-
ny Valdemar Velasquez et ux 7-7-88 
Lots 1-6 Blk 23 Wheeler 

DISTRICT CLERK'S FILINGS 
#9 0 08—Diversified Financial 

Group, Inc. to Donald E. Rives, et al, 
7-1-88, Foreign Judgement 

Gageby 

4 

telling all about his basic training and 
what they did. He will be graduating 
July 14, from 8 weeks basic at Fort 
Leonard Wood, MO. and moving to 
Fort Lee, Virginia for 8 weeks. He is a 
Materials Control and Accounting 
Specialist or Inventory and Supply. He 
said to tell everyone "Hello". We 
wish you well, Robert. God bless you! 

Nice to have Jack Morgan's sister, 
Jean Summers from Jal, New Mexico 
at Gageby Church Sunday with the 
Morgan's. 

Monday Jack and Pat Morgan and 
Chad and Shawn Zybach, Ben 
Meadows and Davy Gilmer went to 
San Antonio to an F.F.A. Convention 
for a few days. 

Brady Hudson is starting to work at 
Celanese Wednesday. Be nice to have 
him and his family closer. Good luck 
in your new job. 

We enjoyed having some young 
folks over after church Sunday night 
for ice cream and games. They 
included besides Lajuana McElroy, 
Claude Laverty, Cheryl Hudson, 
Boyce Crownover, Elizabeth and 
David Hale, Melody Ratliff and 
Frances Hickman. Visiting earlier 
were Frank Hickman, Shawn Everett, 
Karla Murray and Heather Ratliff. 

Karla Murray spent Sunday night 
with Heather Ratliff. Other visitors 
were Gerald Reames and Tucker and 
Tanner and Sue Reames. Cheryl 
Hudson spent Saturday night with 
Melody. 

Bill and Elnita Key of Enoch visited 
Elnita's sister Martha and J.P. Meek. 
They all visited Roy and Lois 

Meadows after church Wednesday 
night and had home made ice cream. 
Evelyn Meek was also there. J.P. and 
Bill went to the livestock sale at 
Wellington Thursday. Willis and I 
went over Thursday night and visited 
at J.P.'s Tuesday night Bill and Elnita 
and J.P. and Martha Meek ate supper 
with Mack and Lynda Sides and family 
at Twitty. The Keys went home Fri. 

Saturday Willis and I and LaJuana 
and Kulani McElroy met Don and 
Mayme McElroy and Josh and Bryan 
Conners and Cherry Platt and Michael 
and Michelle of Durango at Luby's in 
Amarillo for lunch and visiting and 
shopping. Kulani went back home to 
Moriarty, New mexico with her 
family. Cherry's husband, 40, had 
died very suddenly in early June. He 
was the McElroy's pastor and a very 
good friend. They happened to meet 
up with the Plans just before they got 
to Amarillo. We had gotten acquaint-
ed in Durango so were very glad to see 
them, too. 

Sincere sympathy to the family of 
Tom Britt and his many friends. He 
was a grand old man who was friendly 
and helpful to all in the community, 
church, school. Like Jesus, he went 
about doing good, an example to us 
all. 

Luke 6: 27, 28 Love your enemies, 
do good to those who hate you, bless 
those who curse you. 

Live so that when people get to 
know you, they will get to know 
Christ. 

I sure enjoyed Rev. Jimmy Davis 
and Laura's visit. I hadn't seen her 
since her surgery but she is looking 
very well and visiting with Jim again. 
He said he had been making apricot 
jam. I just wish Ernie could boil water. 

Wheeler had a lovely fourth of July. 
I'm sure quite a few people attended 
but the weather turned out to be hot 
and muggy. Ernest attended for a 
short time and said there sure were 
lots of people. 

Boyd Kennedy's daughter Jeannie 
Coogler from Houston has been with 
her daddy, Boyd Kennedy thru his 
surgery in Amarillo. He is doing fine 
and will be home soon. 

Margaret Trout has been enjoying 
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	Connie Fisher and Kendra and Jerrod 
from Sudan, Tex. 

Madge Horton from Fort Windgate, 
Arizona has been visiting in Wheeler 
with Sallie Harris and on Saturday she 
came to Mobeetie and visited Jess and 
Gazelle Patterson. 

George Stracener from Wichita 
Falls and Cora Lee Darwell, Sperry 
Stone, Ark. visited in the home of 
Ariza and Anna Belle Corcoran ove 
over the weekend. George is Anna 
Belle's cousin. 

The family of Claudia and Win 
Quarles met at Buttercreek Guest 
Ranch at Red River, Colo. for a family 
vacation together. 

Those who attended were Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Quarles and Kelley, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Shahan and Rusty 
Arnett, Mr. and Mrs. Tiny Simpson 
and Linda from Amarillo, Shirley 
Simpson of Amarillo and friend Troy, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Pat Rucker and 
Cassie from Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kevin Crawford and Courtney from 
Pampa, Claudia Quarles. 

Everyone enjoyed the good fishing 
especially Kelley Quarles who caught 
the big one. 

Those who enjoyed supper at Don 
and Mary Margaret Quarles on Friday 
night were Connie Fisher, Kendra and 
Jared from Amhurst, Margaret Trout, 
Kevin and Donna Crawford and baby 
from Pampa, Courtney, Shonda, Roy 
Pat Rucker and Cassie from Pampa. 

Elnita Atkins had a very nice 4th of 
July she spent it in Amarillo with her 
family. Herbert and Loretta Atkins 
and son Byno and wife and Tina, twin 

• girls Lisa and Laura and other 
children, Tony Atkins and wife Royce 
and son Josh. They had a barbecue at 
a lovely lake. 

On the way home she visited in 
Pampa with her sister Fannie West. 

She visited with her twin sister 
Juanita Lightfoot awhile in Amarillo. 

Old Mobeetie Association Monthly Meeting 

Marvin and Darren Grimes from 
Lubbock ate dinner with Doyle and 
Bulah Grimes on the 4th. 

Sunday 3rd, Doyle and Bulah 
visited in the Canadian nursing Home 
with Mary Brewer and Tommie Allen. 
They enjoyed the Canadian Rodeo 
also very much. 

Jimmy and Margaret Coward from 
St. Lewis visited Charlotte over the 
fourth. They attended the Canadian 
Rodeo and ou to Gene Cowards 
fishing. 

Leonia Williams went to Peggy 
Dunns in Canadian and played golf 
with Peggy. She stayed from Friday 
until the 4th. 

Cathy Dunn, daughters Mattie and 
Taffney met Tanya at Clinton, Okla. 
and they spent a week with them. 

Johnny and Debbie Bailey and boys 
Matt, Mark and Luke celebrated 
Independence Day on July 2nd, with 
his parents Jap and Alice Bailey. 

Others present for the fireworks 
were Larry and Judy Parker and sons 
John Forbes and Man Parker and 
grandson Steve Wortham from 
Pampa. 

The LaWayne Hogans visited with 
Jess and Gazelle Patterson over the 
fourth of July. 

Jimmy and Madge Horton from 
Kirkland, New Mexico visited Jess 
and Gazelle Patterson over the 4th of 
July. 

Mr. R. St. John is attending a 
family reunion in Denver, Colorado. 

The James Family celebrated Bill 
and Shannon James birthday over 
July 4th. 

The James family attended the 4th 
of July celebration in Wheeler. Mr. 
and Mrs. Mark Thompson and 
children and Billie and Kathy James 
also attended. 

Mr. and Mrs. James nephew Ricky 
Allison and children Carol, Krissy and 
Corey from Oklahoma City visited 
Billie James over the 4th of July. 

Peggy Dunn and mother Leona 
Williams will go to Amarillo Sunday 
evening and catch a plane to Sacra-
mento, Calif. to spend a week with 
Tince's sister. 

When I came in from the hospital 
my good friends Earl and Mabel 
Tabor and Anna Belle and Ariza 
Corcoran came for a visit Monday 
night. 

Joe Kelley and Betty Rains left 
Friday taking 5 horses to the races in 
Ada, Okla. where they will take part in 
the horse races. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Malone have a 
exchange student, Claudia, living 
with them. On the fourth of July they 
took her visiting at Palo Duro Canyon. 

Jeff Kelley visited in Amarillo 
Monday. He visited with Robert, 
Linda and Robin Kelley, with Mary 
Beth, Don and Shonda Schoon and 
Mildred Pugh. 

Velma and Ray Forbes visited in 

t 

The OMA Jail Museum group met 
on Thursday 7th July at 7:00 P.M. 
1988 in the hospitality room of the Fir-
st State Bank in Mobeetie. 

Meeting was called to order by 
Sallie Harris with a prayer by Louise 
Hogan. Austin Caldwell read the 
minutes of the last meeting and 
Louise Hogan gave the Treasurers 
report. The president called for ap-
proval of both reports, Henry 
Johnston made a motion both be ac-
cepted as read; seconed by Jap Bailey 
and all approved same. 

The report of treasurer showed that 
the sum of $800.00 was granted by the 
gcommissioners Court after Sallie 
Harris met with them requesting a 
need for expenses of museum upkeep 
and some for the application of a 
historical marker for the Mobeetie 
American legion, as they were the fir-
st to restore the jail of 1886 in old town 
to be used for the American Legion 
and Auxiliary meetings place in 1950. 
The Legion had become inactive in the 
1970's so the town organized The Old 
Mobeetie Association and began ef-
forts to again restore the old jail to be 
used for a museum. 

Sallie Harris brought the contract 
for the new caretakers, Albert and 

FFA From Page 1 

Ruby Cavanass to read. It is to be 
signed before a notary public. Albert 
had some very good ideas that he 
presented to the group as possible 
ways and means of raising some 
money for the museum. The main one 
was a large sign to be place on Ithvay 
152 showing that we have water and 
electricity for campers to use all year 
round on the museum premises. Also 
he had other things that was 
discussed for each to ponder over and 
see if they can be used to faise funds 
in the future. He had the broken win-
dows in one cell repaired at the lum-
ber yard, and bought some lumber 
and screen to repair porch and door on 
trailer home. All the sce around the 
museum has been mowed and the 
place is much improved. since there is 
no charge to view the museum we are 
depending on donations principally 
for our upkeep and improvement so 
we thank you very much for any 
donation you feel like giving. 

We are very happy to welcome Al 
and Ruby Cavanass and each one said 
a hearty thanks to them by giving 
them a pounding at the end of the 
meeting for having joined us. 

The Blue Grass group had three 
visiting us Thursday and we 
welcomed Bill McKnight for coming 
and talking with us. Members present 
were Henry Johnston, Jack Finster-
wald, Laura Eubanks, Jap Bailey, 
Austin Caldwell, Louis Hogan, Bob 
Galmor, Ruby Cavanass, Albert 
Cavanass and Sallie Harris meeting 
adjourned at 8:30. The museum had 
196 visitors in June. • 

I 

We have had a shower last Monday 
think it was, we had a little shower 
Friday, nice one. 

Marie Brown came to her mother's, 
Eunice Edwards this weekend. She 
was mowing her yard this morning. 

Mable got 11/2  inches of rain Wed-
nesday. 

Mable is looking for Jimmie and 
Sandy Ault tomorrow, Sunday they 
are at Amarillo now. Bill and Neta 
Ault, Clif and Dorothy Ogle, James 
and Bea Ogle and girls. Kevin and 
June Shaffield, Sue and Andra Hur-
senrades have visited for a week they 
are going home tomorrow to Dallas. 

7:30 Saturday evening we are get-
ting another little shower of rain. 

Wafford Ed Helton and wife Lillie 
from Choctaw, OK are visiting Mattie 
Sunday afternoon. 

Tommie Hayes preached Sunday at 
Church of Christ. Preached on repen-
tence, he does real good, talks real 
slow and plain. 

Anna Dukes son Jimmy Puett, is 
still holding on, they did a lot of skin 
grafting last week, poor guy, think 
that grafting is pain. 

Colie has gone to Wheeler to get 
some peaches Monday morning at 
Sechrists, they say he has trees galore 
full of peaches, can't sell them. Doc 
Wilhelm said he had hogs galore all 
sizes can't sell them, feed is so high 
he can't give them away. 

Whats the world coming to, what 
we buy so high, what we have for sale 
so low. 

Gary, Weldon called to see how 
Colies foot is, he is better this mor-
ning, if he would stay off it. He is gone 
now to peach orchard, if he don't stay 
on it so long. 

The rain got close enough we heard 
thunder yesterday, no rain, last 2 days 
yet, big dew. 

1 looked out this Monday morning, 
everything is so quite and still out 
there makes you have a funny feeling, 
we had a butcher bird come in think 
they have eat all of our little birds and 
bird eggs, we don't see any of any 
kind around. The black bird also took 
a told on them they eat the eggs in the 
nest. 

Dan and Lou Trimble and children 
visited her parents. B. F. and Margie 
Meadows Sunday. Others there were 
E. J. and Joy Meadows and Misty. 
Richard and Bonny Meadows and 
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over 53,000 active members and more 
than 500,000 former members. 

During the convention, over 2,000 
award winners will be recognized with 
more than 1,500 members receiving 
the Lone Star Farmer Degree, the 
highest level of recognition by the 
state association. Educational scholar- Wheeler Senior Citizens 
ships totaling more than $525.000 will 

July  Meeting  
be presented to many of the members  
in attendance. 	 The Wheeler Senior Citizens met 

Walter York, Executive Secretary, Monday night July 11th instead of 
reports that deserving adults who July 4th, for their regular business 
have supported the FFA and its and dinner night with 23 members 
activities will be recognized by the present and three guests who were 
presentation of Honorary State Far- Jean Pollock from Maryland, Doris 
mer degrees, Distinguished Service Finsterwald and Ruth Hoggard of 
Awards, VIP Awards, and the Blue Wheeler. Members present were 
and Gold Award. 	 Helene and Eli Sabbe, Claudy and Ina 

Outstanding nationally known Mae Brotherton, Harrold and Mae 
motivational speakers scheduled Nash, Jess and Curtis Moore, 
during the three-day convention in- Lawrence Lancaster, Eupha Mae Sot-
dude Stan White, Stephenville, Texas enson, Elva Wood, Mary Finsterwald, 
and John Crudele, Ames, Iowa. In Jewell Holloman, Opal Davidson, 
addition, Kelli Evans, National Grace Burk. Loyd Davidson, Fannie 
President, Lincoln, Nebraska, will Mae Bradstreet, Oleta Jones, Sallie 
address the convention on Thursday Harris, Irma Kirk, Hestell Killings-
night during the Stars Over Texas worth, Pet Sims and Vea Fillingim. 
Award Program. Toby Miller, State 	After the bountiful meal the pro- 
President from Whitharral FFA gram was special numbers rendered 
Chapter, Whitharral, Texas, will pre- by Claudy and Mae Brotherton and 
side at the general sessions. These accompanied at the piano by their 
sessions will include the election of daughter Doris Finsterwald which was 
the 1988-89 state president from the enjoyed by all. 
state officer candidates nominated by 	Games of 88 and dominoes were 
the 10 area associations. From 10 area played. Our game night will be next 
nominees, voting delegates will also week as usual, 3rd Monday night. 
select the state FFA sweetheart to r -- 	 - 
represent the state association during 	L Os ten to . . . 

1988-89. Those in attendance will hear 
and recognize the Outstanding Public 
Speaker who will represent Texas at 
the National FFA Convention in 
Kansas City. Missouri. 

From Page 5 
got off work at the Wheeler Care 
Center, they all went down to the 
Canadian River and played in the 
water like little kids. 

Ray and Pat Hudson got to have all 
their kids together over the holidays 
and included Cheryl Hudson Rodney 
and Keri Hudson of Levelland, Cindy 
and Rodney Sweet and Jessie of 
Borger, Brady and Cynthia Hudson 
and Megan and Crystal of Stillwater 
and Sonya Paul of Amarillo. Kelley's 
family was getting together so he 
couldn't come. 

Nice to have Dan and Chris Fillin-
gim meet us for lunch at Long John 
Silvers Thursday in Elk City. Willis, 
Lajuana, Kulani and I went and got 
grass seed there. 

Sunday dinner guests at Evelyn 
Meek home were Aaron and Claudetta 
Laverty, Claude and Caaron, Virginia 
Aycock and Carolan. 

Rick and Lucy Lucas and Charissa 
and Russell came Sunday from West-
port, Kentucky to visit Roy and Lois 
Meadows and othes for a few days. So 
good to have those sweet people out to 
church Sunday night. 

Melody Ratliff is spending a week 
in Pampa with her cousin, Tina 
Reames. 

Cecil Reynolds and Rev. Gene 
Russell went to Cleburne Friday night 
and got 33 more baby calves for E.O. 
Kelly. 

Lindsey Fillingim and Jenny Van 
Vranken went swimming Friday. 
Jennifer Maddox and Lindsey went 
swimming Sunday. 

Lisa Bennett got word that she 
made the president's Honor Roll at 
West Texas State and would have a 
$200 scholarship toward her fall 
tuition at W.T. Congratulations! 

Kulani and LaJuana McElroy ate 
supper Thursday night and played 
games with Laura Lee Norris and 
family, Dianne and Jerel Norris and 
Jared. Others there were Colby 
Butcher and Scott Walker. 

Earline Hefley from California came 
Tuesday to visit with her parents, 
Clifford and Pauline Hefley and Jim 
and Beth Alvey and David and Phyllis 
Hefley and Darren, and Kristi. They 
were all getting together at Maxey's 
Friday night. I enjoyed going by and 
visiting with them Friday morning. 

Richard and Bonnie Meadows and 
Leslie, Ben and Reagan went on 
vacation to Red River last week. David 
and Phyllis Hefley and Darren and 
Kristi also went to Red River. 
Meadows got back Friday night. 
Hefleys got back Sunday. 

Gene and Rhonda Ferguson and 
Mandy, Rusty and Ty, Dale and Janet 
Stevens, and Nikki, Rhonda, Travis, 
and Brooke, Kenneth and Jua Jaun 
Stokes and family and Steven 
O'Gorman family from Shamrock all 
attended a Stevens family reunion of 
all Rhonda and Dale's brothers and 
sisters and families at Lake Murray 
near Ardmore June 27 to July 1. Lots 
of things to do there besides visiting 
and swimming. Had lots of fun. 

In the girls softball tournament 
there will be teams for Briscoe, Miami 
and two Wheeler teams. Each team 
will play every other team. 

Brad and Sue Chandler and Jana 
and Bridget visited Peggy Chandler in 
Allison Sunday and Saturday and 
helped get ready for the Gilmer, 
Chandler, Boydston reunion Satur-
day, July 16. Also there were Cindy 
Burrus and Tiffaney and Brett from 
Canyon. 

Wheeler County 4-H dress review 
was at Briscoe Thursday. There were 
several entries and all did real well. 
From Briscoe Melody and Mandy 
Ratliff and Keri Nelson will get to go 
to district at Frank Phillips College, 
Borger on July. 25. Congratulations! 
Also Jeromey Vorheis from Allison 
will go. 

Gageby Church kids 7th grade up 
will go to Panfork Youth Camp 
Monday 18th of July. 

Jenny Van Vranken spent Friday 
night with Keri Nelson. 

Larry and Vickey Nelson and family 
and Elmer and Cathy Harrison and 
boys went to Greenbelt Lake Sunday 
and played in the water and boated 
and skied some and had a nice picnic. 

Saundra Meek spent Thursday and 
Friday nights with Evelyn Meek. 

Travis Goad spent Saturday night 
with Dallas Fillingim. 

Guess there are a few people who 
read my news. Some missed it this 
past week. I don't know why it wasn't 
in the Wheeler Times. I mailed it 
Tuesday as usual. Sorry about that. 

We were pleased to get a very 
interesting letter from Robert Hall 

List of instruments filed In Wheeler 
County Clerk's office for the week of 
July 1 thru July 7, 1988 

JULY 1, 1988 
MD—Ronald D. Pitcock et ux to 

Bronco Oil Co. 6-21-88 S/2 Sec 14 Blk 
A-8 

DT—Bill Fraley et al to The First 
State Bank of Mobeetie 	-- 

EXT DT—Citizens Bank & Trust 
Co. to Rex McAnelly 	-- 

ASSIGN—Dakkar Production Co. to 
CWF Associates, LTD. 6-29-88 See 
Instrument 

MD—Dakkar Production Co. to 
WF Associates, LTD. 6-29-88 Pt Sec 
47 BIk 23 

RDT—First National Bank in Pam-
pa to Dakkar Production Co. 5-16-88 
See Instrument 

ASSIGN—Louise Herbert Brown 
Trust to HAD 6-27-88 N/2 Sec 32 Blk 
A-4 

ROW—Domer Miller to Nagasco 
Gathering Company of Texas 5-27-88 
W/2 W/2 SE/4 Sec 10 Blk 2 B&B 
Survey 

ROW—Densel Reed to Nagasco 
Gathering Company of Texas 6-1-88 
Sec 2 Blk 1 B&B Survey 

ROW—Gynell Thompson to 
Nagasco Gathering Company of Texas 
6-1-88 Sec 2 Blk 1 B&B Survey 

ROW—Alice Ula Burress to 
Nagasco Gathering Company of Texas 
6-1-88 Sec 2 BIk 1 B&B Survey 

ROW—Jewell Odene Rasco to 
Nagasco Gathering Company of Texas 
6-1-88 Sec 2 Blk 1 B&B Survey 

EXECUTORS D—Lula Berry to 
John C. Thomas 4-13-88 See 
Instrument 

C/C PROB—Lula Berry to EX 
PARTE 4-26-88 

JULY 4, 1988 
Holiday 
JULY 5, 1988 
MERGER—Federal Land Bank of 

Texas et al to Farm Credit Bank of 
Texas 6-30-88 

P OF A—Edna G. Thomas et al to 
Kevin H. Berry 5-1-88 

P OF A—Lois Cantrell et al to Lela 
Margaret Church 5-2-88 

MD—Harold D. Thomas to Edna G. 
Thomas 4-25-88 W/2 SE SW Sec 92 
Blk 17 20 min acs 

ASSIGN—Trafalgar House Oil and 
Gas, Inc. to James M. Fitzpatrick, III 
et al 3-12-88 

ASSIGN—Trafalgar House Oil and 
Gas, Inc. to Robert E. Henderson et al 
6-1-88 See Instrument 

AOL—Federated Natural Resour-
ces Corp. to Dyco Petroleum Corp. 
5-1-88 See Instrument 

AFF HEIRSHIP—LaCrecia A. 
Lewis to William Blair Albright et al 
6.15-88 

AOL—Petroleum Consultants to 
Explorer Oil & Gas, Inc. 7-4-88 See 
Instrument 

AOL—Explorer Oil & Gas, Inc. to 
Dana Fraley 7-4-88 W/2 SE/4 Sec 4 
Blk RE 

AOL—Panhandle Consultants, Inc. 
to Explorer Oil & Gas, Inc. 7-4-88 See 
Instrument 

AOL—Michael D. Fife to Explorer 
Oil & Gas, Inc. 5-30-88 S/2 N/2 Sec 
114 BIk 23 

AOL—Harrie P. W. Perkins to Ex-
plorer Oil & Gas, Inc. 6-15-88 SE/4 
Sec 4 Blk RE NE/4 Sec 23 Blk RE 

AOL—Mrs. M.G. Perkins to Ex-
plorer Oil & Gas, Inc. 6-15-88 SE/4 
Sec 4 Blk RE NE/4 Sec 23 BIk RE 

AOL—Richard Bourne to Explorer 
Oil & Gas, Inc. 6-28-88 S/2 N/2 Sec 
114 Blk 23 

JULY 6, 1988 
EXT OL—Fred Jackson to Dan E. 

Steed 5-6-88 N/2 Sec 11 BIk 27 
EXT OL—Fred Jackson to Dan E. 

Steed 5-6-88 S/2 Sec 11 Blk 27 
D—Elnita Atkins to William H. 

Atkins et ux 7-3-88 SE/4 Sec 45 BIk 
A-5 

EXECUTOR D—Mary Helen 
Thompson et vir to Raybourne Thom-
pson, Jr. et al 6-17-88 

MD—A. W. Burrell et ux to L. H. 
Davidson et ux 7-5-88 Sec 48 Blk A-3 

ROY D—A. W. Burrell et ux to L. 
H. Davidson et ux 7-5-88 SW/4 Sec 3 
AB&M Survey 

MD—A. W. Burrell et ux to L. H. 
Davidson et ux 7-5-88 NW/4 Sec 49 
Blk A-7 

RDT—L. H. Davidson to Arthur W. 
Burrell 7-5-88 E/2 S/3 BIk 53 Stanley 
Add Wheeler 

JULY 7, 1988 
AOL-R. C. Callan to McKinney 

Operating Company 7-1-88 
RMML—Texas Bank and Trust 

Company to F. C. Hilburn, Jr. et ux 
7-1-88 E60' Lots 19 & 20 Blk F Potts 
Add Shamrock 

ASSIGN—Bob Miller to Trigg 
Drilling Company Inc. 6-27-88 Sec 8 
Blk RE 

ROW—Lynn Smith et vir to Cabot 
Gas Supply Corporation 7-5-88 Pt. Sec 
36 Blk M-1 

MD—Frances V. Connolly to Con-
nolly Family Trust 7-5-88 

ASSIGN—Hawkins Oil & Gas, Inc. 

children, Brady and Mary Meadows. 
I just realized Dan's mother passed 

away last week. Our sympathy goes 
out to him and all of her relatives and 
friends. 

Talked to Lacy Walker Monday 
morning, she is Bill Walker's 
daughter, they are moving to Cliff and 
Dorothy's place. Cliff and Dorothy are 
moving to Wheeler. She is 15 there 
are 3 children we all know Bill, he was 
reared here. We will miss Cliff and 
Dorothy, we sure wont mind having 
Bill and family for neighbors. 

Cliff and Dorothy visited Alton and 
Ellie Wilkerson at Clarendon over 
weekend. 

Last Tuesday Mary Hudson went to 
Wheeler with Mae Welch, Thursday 
she visited Mae. Sunday Ray and Pat 
Hudson took Mary out to eat at 
Sparlins (I think it was out east of 
town.) 

David and Becky Zybach went to 
Lubbock over weekend to celebrate 
their 21 wedding anniversary. 

Addie Swift's brother Fred and 
Edith Castle from Shannon came from 
the weekend. Saturday they went to 
visit the Calvin Stuarts west of 
Mobeetie. Sunday they visited Beulah 
Stuart at Sweetwater. 

Gayle has bought her a house and 
she starts working in the hospital this 
morning, Monday. Hope she wont 
care for me putting this in paper 
forgot her last name, she has been 
staying with Fat and Wanda 
Childress. We are glad for her. 

The Pee Wee baseball players had a 
party at Canadian, they went swim-
ming had ice cream, cookies, all the 
parents of each kid went, this was 
Friday. 

Bob Ratliff and family went to Colo. 
last week on a little trip. It was nice 
and cool up there Mrs. Ratliff said. 

Mrs. Gene Ferguson said they were 
in Pampa most of last week. Gene had 
cataract surgery on his eyes, he is 
doing ok. He is pretty young to have 
that trouble. 

We hope he continues to improve, 
nothing like some good eyes. 

Vivian Baker was visiting Mattie 
Monday morning, some one else 
knocked on her door as I was talking to 
her. 

Lou Dean and K. D. Douthit went to 
Pampa last Saturday. 

Visitors in the K.D. Douthit home 
on Sunday were Bob and Deb Kin-
naman and children. Tressa spent 
Saturday night with them. 

Bob and Deb Kinnaman and 
children went to Altus lake on Satin-
day. 

K. D. Douthit went to Amarillo 
Monday. 



LB. 

SLICED HALF OR WHOLE 
LB- 786 

ilia BIM MUM 

    

QUARTERED 

BLUEBONNET 
MA,RipeINE 

    

DELSEY 

BATHROOM 
TISSUE 
4 ROIL PEG. 

19' 

        

        

        

    

FOR 19  

    

        

        

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 	 WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

ALL PURPOSE 

razz. SHURSAVING 
FLOUR 	 F,Lpyit 

	 9' 
WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

SOU'italEF 	CHEETOS 
REG. $1.59 SIZE 

,39 4 

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 7 

HI-DRI 

PAPER 
TOWELS 

JUMBO ROLLS 

2,0,39 4 
WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

45. OFF LABEL-FOR FABRICS 

DOWNY 
SOFTENER 

64 OZ. BTL. 

$ 1 39 CDOWny 

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD B 

TENDERCRUST SPLIT TOP 

WHITE 
BREAD 
1I/7 LB. LOAF 

  

   

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

PRE-CREAMED 

MRS. TUCKERS Ar-w.4 
liTtcxer4 SHORTENING 
ruhrrhsnNUM  _,I 	 OZ.  

49' 
WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

ALL TYPES 

COCA-
COLA 

2 LITER BOTTLE 

JUMBO ITALIAN SWEETgpli 	$ 	
00 

RED ONIONS 4
1 

C 

$ 1 00. NEW CROP TEXAS PREMIUM RED 

POTATOES 4 
CALIFORNIA FRESH GREEN 	

$ 1 00 . 

ONIONS ... 	BUNCHES 

CALIFORNIA FRESH GREEN 

BEANS 	 LB 79 

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS...WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 

AFFILIATED 
FOCOS INC. 
MEMBER STORE 

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JULY 10-16,1988 

Food Stamp Customers 

Are Welcome! 

•	 

BORDEN'S 

ICE 
CREAM 

2/1 / 2 Gal. 
Rds.  

378 
	 sq 

Sausage (9.0 oz.) 	Assorted 
Cheese (8.0 oz.) 	Flavors 

Pepperoni (8.5 oz.) 8-9 oz. Box 

Save 786 

LB. 

EXTRA LARGE SIZE 

• 

WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED SLICED 

COOK'S WHOLE 

SMOKED 
PICNICS 

6-8 LB. AVERAGE SLAB BACON 

129 
LB. 

HILLSHIRE FARM SMOKED/ BEEF SMO/ POLISH 

SAUSAGE ""T F""ll ""LB 
LEAN TRIM FAMILY PAK 8-11 ASST. 

PORK CHOPS 	 LB.  
LEAN TRIM COUNTRY STYLE 

PORK RIBS 	 LB.  

SHURSAVING 

HOMOGENIZED 

ONENGIAILLY4(JUG 

$1 19 
WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD 

$
LEAN TRIM CENTR CUT 

9
7 PORK CHOPS 	 LB .  

PURDUE GROUND 
S 79 

TURKEY MEAT 1Re, 
CHEF'S PANTRY PRECOOKED CHICKEN FRIED 9 79 
PATTIES 	 LB. 

$249 
79. 
929 

BONUS BUCKS 
By shopping with us, you will be able to 

take advantage of the tremendous savings 
we will be offering each week. 

1. You'll receive one BONUS BUCK COUPON with 
each 55.00 purchase* at our supermarkets. 

2. 6 BONUS BUCKS COUPONS will fill a SAVER 
CARD; SAVER CARDS are available at the 
checkouts. 

3. Each SAVER CARD may be redeemed for one 
BONUS BUCK SPECIAL. Watch our weekly ads for 
each week's SPECIALS. 

It's as simple as that...SO COME ON IN 
AND ENJOY THE SAVINGS WITH BONUS 
BUCKS. 

it Lacer portimits prehilelod 6y imr. 

It. 

TEXAS FRESH ZUCCHINI OR 

YELLOW 
SQUASH 

LB 39c 

SOFT 
SUNDAE 

6 PACK BOX  

$229 

$ 1 49 
BANQUET ASST.  

CREAM PIES 	1:(?),7 99` 
GREEN GIANT ASST 	 S 1 69 
PASTA ACCENTS VI -

U 

DAIRY DELIGHTS 

ywSwlI 

ORANGE 
JUICE 

BISCUITS 
57V, 099c 

CANS 

I AV 
1, 	

►
"G 	 SHURSAVING 

CHEESE SINGLES 

PKG . 
12 OZ. 89c 

AUNT JEMIMA ORIG.  

PANCAKE 
MIX 

2 LB. BOX 99c 

AUNT JEMIMA 
BUTTERLITE; LITE 

PANCAKE 
SYRUP 
24 OZ. BTL. 

$219 

40. OFF LABEL 
W FABRIC SOFTENER 

FAB 
DETERGENT 

42 OZ. BOX 

$ 169 

CALIFORNIA 
SWEET JUICY 

PEACHES OR 
NECTARINES 

I
IBETTY CROCKER ASSORTED 

X 

Fr"  • , 
ORE-IDA FRIES OR GOLDEN 

g~ - CRINKLES 
2 LB. BAG 

KRAFT CHILLED 

ORANGE 
JUICE64 OZ. R 

$ 1 99 

PILLSBURY ASST. 
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