
CWE CHAT 
WITH 
EDITOR 

By Louis C. Stas 
We heeded the warning of the 

impending winter storm and 
headed for OKC to be there for 
Seth in case the daycare was 
closed on Thursday and Friday. 

— cwe — 
Jennifer called to advise us to 

bring grocercies, as the shelves 

• were being emptied in preparation 
for the storm. 

— cwe — 
-In taking her advice, we found 

lots of local people shopping 
Thriftway in preparation. 

— cwe — 
We arrived with the food and 

began cooking all the good stuff 
that 'makes winter bearable — 
ham, beans, soup, etc.. If we lost 
electricity, the meals would only 
have to be warmed up. 

— cwe — 
The Meriwethers were at their 

'lake home'. They have a fireplace 
and gas cookstove; there would 
be our refuge if necessary. 

— cwe — 
OKC also escaped the worst 

of the ice and was not out of elec-
tricity. 

— cwe — 
Jennifer got off work early both 

Thursday and Friday and Seth 
stayed home with us, so he did 
not have to be out on the icy 
streets. 

— cwe — 
Leroy. Rhonda and Stormie • came over and we made the best 

of the situation; we got in several 
games of cards. 

— cwe — 
We started the storm off with the 

most essentials food; Rhonda 
brought over chilli. This was fol-
lowed by cornbread, cherry cob-
bler and chocolate cake. 

— cwe — 
The Windstar was coated with 

ice and I had to crawl in through 
the back to get inside. 

— cwe — 
We made preparations to leave 

Sunday afternoon and called 
Wheeler to learn you were fogged 
in here and there was still ice on 
some of the highways. Visability 
was about a car's length. 

— cwe — 
Monday morning dawned with 

some fog and the roads once 
again frozen. 
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STORM REPORT 
As Reported by . . 

Stormie Meriwether, 
First Grade Student - 

Dear Friends, The snow is 
great! We don't go to school. We 
just stay at home and eat. Some-
times I go to Seth's house. Jen-
nifer let us paint. I loved it! We 
can paint with a brush or our 
hands and our feet. Jenna won't 
let me mix the colors. Only Seth 
can mix the colors 'cause he's a 
baby. I like to mix the colors too. 
I love to paint. 

I want to go to Texas, Wheeler 
I miss my Cupcake. My dad let 
me ride him without a saddle. It 
was so fun! I can ride like an In-
dian girl. I know Cupcake is ok 
'cause my cowboys take care of 
him for me. My cowboys are the 
best! 

My Suzy dog was chasing Ma-
son (dog). Mason ran to the dock. 

*jumped on the boat and slid in the 
lake. We didn't see him. We 
called the dogs to come in and 
Mason wasn't there. We called 
and called. Then we saw Mason 
on the outside of the fence by the 
water. He saved himself and 
climbed on the dock by the boat. 

'*We saw the tracks in the snow and 
where he slid down the boat. He 
was wet and cold. He was so 
happy to be safe he ran and 
played in the snow. Then I took 
him inside and rubbed him dry 
with a towel. I'm so happy Ma-
son is safe. That's it. 

• 

• 

ki 

WORK BEGINS: Repair work has begun on the old American Legion 
building, the future home of the Wheeler Historical Museum. The first 
step in restoring the building is repairing the roof. 

__sag 
SNOW PILE: A pickup drives past the pile of snow at the west end of 
t00 E. Texas in Wheeler on Tuesday morning The official moisture 
measurement was 2.03". 

Snow, Ice Slows Wheeler Down 
some of our neighbors. A 1 1/2" 
of ice and sleet first covered the 
ground. followed by 2-3" snow. A 
amount of 10-12" was reported in 
the northern edge of the county. 

Fortunately, the ice coating was 
not too heavy on the trees and 

ines.  
citizens were stocking The City of Wheeler will hold an 

highl 
Area 

election May 8, 2010, for the pur- 
pose of electing a Mayor and (2

rwleir shelves, preparing for the 

council members. The positions 	
ors( on Wednesday.
The courthouse and schools 

will be for a two-year term. The were closed Thursday and Friday. first day for filing of an application 	
The weekend brought a dust- for a place on the ballot is 	Feb- ing of snow. Sunday dawned with 

ruary 6, 2010. The last day to fog throughout the area, which 
apply for a place on the ballot is coated trees and hindered traffic. 
March 8, 2010. 

Anyone interested in filing for an Black ice was present in the area  
application for a place on the bal- Sunday morning.The fog remained, but lightened 
lot should come by City Hall 505 during the day on Monday. 
Alan Bean Blvd., Wheeler, kxas. 	The process of "digging out" be- 
Office hours: 8:00 A.M. until 5:00 gan immediately. 
PM. Monday - Friday. 

Wheeler High a Jr. Hi. 

First Semester Honor Roll 

Wheeler, the Texas Panhandle 	Wheeler was not hit as bad as 
and Oklahoma received warnings 
of the winter storm headed their 
way in advance. 

City To Elect Mayor, 
Two Councilmen 
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Wheeler Chamber Requesting 
Nominations For Recognition 

7th Grade-Ail A's-Abby Bond, 
Mitchell Ford; All A&B-Stefany 
Barboza, Don Butler, Troy 
Duncan, Brenda Garcia. Justin 
Hardcastle. Aileen Hinojos, Kori 
Howard, Destrie Kinnaman. Tay-
lor McClendon, Guili Mendoza, 
Zulema Mendoza, Bryan Parra, 
Brittney Robinson, Chisum Ruth-
erford 

8th Grade-All A's-Stormy 
Moore; All A&B-Payton Leffew, 
Tre McElveney. Megan Reed, 
Brody Richardson, Kylie 
Schubert, Andrew Soto, Hannah 
Stiles, Juan Torres, Gabriela 

Amarillo College 
Scholarship Awards 

The Ora Belinda School-House 
Early Learning Center is very ex-
cited and thankful that we have 
staff members that have been 
approved for Amarillo College 
scholarships to continue their edu-
cation in Child Development and 
Early Childhood through the Pan-
handle Workforce Solutions Child 
Care Services 

These team members include: 
Rebeeca Orient, Lead Teacher 
Elizabeth Couch, Lead Tea-

cher 
Lakeisha Applewhite, Assistant 

Teacher 
Ann Porter, Director  

Venzor, Jake Ware 
9th Grade-All A's-Daniel 

Gonzalez, Danielle Johnson, 
Breann Robinson: All A&B-
Ricardo Avila, Danielle Garcia. 
Elizabeth Horton, Alyssa 
Kinnaman, Zack McCasland, 
David Pichardo. MaryCruz Rocha, 
Karen Rodriguez, Damian Sales 

10th Grade-All A's-Alyssa 
Johnson; All A&B-Makynzi 
Blankenship, Tanzia Brown, Ilene 
Butler, Veronica Carrillo, Trevor 
Carr-Marshall. Hayden Guest, 
Shayla Horton, Paige Jones, 
Gabby Menefield, Sidney Mills, 
Kellen Moore, Bailey Noles 

11th Grade-All A's-Spencer 
Ford, Omar Lopez, Kaylee 
Marion, Karen Mendoza, Jaten 
Moore; All A&B-Raul Batista, 
Elizabeth Castillo, Tania Flores, 
Colin Hampton, Stacie Hanson, 
Rachel Kidd, Robert Lewis, 
Giovanna Luna, Carla Mendoza, 
Jacobo Mendoza, Troy Miller, 
Jorge Porras, Rolondo Salas, 
Haley Sparks, Taylor Sparks, Cole 
Wilson 

12th Grade-All A's-Danna 
Gallardo, Josh Hardcastle, Nick 
Hardcastle, Tracy Keelin, Karina 
Pacheco, Whitney Reed, Sara 
Salazar, Presley Thomas; All 
A&B-Linsey Altamirano, Osbaldo 
Arzabala, Nathan Benefield, 
Osvaldo Carrillo, Hugo Corral, 
Gerardo Diaz, Jonathan Engles, 
Maricela Engles, Aaron Gaines, 
Darren Gaines. Ashley Gallagher, 
Cesar Gonzalez, Terry Menefield, 
Macie Miller, Braden Moore, 
Kenton Petit, Frankie Ramirez, 
Bailey Richardson, Brock Sabbe, 
Makenzi Stiles, Jonathan Venzor 

Assisted Living:  
Annie Ruth Lee 
Marcilla Payne 
Mary Whitener 

Admissions: 
12/30 	Ernestine Holmes 
1/24 	Barbara Beard 
1/25 	T. J. Cole, Jr. 
1/26 	Tiffany Moon 
1/31 	Rowdy Clark 
Dismissals: 
1/26 	Jannell Dunnam 

Dena Brown 
1/27 	T. J. Cole, Jr. 

Kenneth Frankenbery 
Tiffany Moon 

Early Voting Will 
Begin February16 

Early Voting in person will be at 
the County Clerks office in 

On Tuesday, January 26th, 
2010, Christy Bell, Membership 
Sales Manager for Air Evac 
Lifeteam out of Elk City Oklahoma 
presented information to the 
Wheeler Lions Club regarding the 
services provided by the member-
ship-based air ambulance service. 

The service started in 1985 
when a group of businessmen in 
West Plains, Missouri met to dis-
cuss the plight of their rural com-
munity and its lack of access to 
adequate trauma care in the event 
of a life or limb threatening medi-
cal emergency. Their solution was 
to establish a helicopter air am-
bulance service. However, rather 
program, the helicopter would be 
placed in the rural community 
where the people live and work. 
This concept made good sense, 
but required financial support on 
an ongoing basis. Thus, the 
founders established their pro-
gram based on a membership-
based model operated by Rega, 
a Swiss air ambulance company. 

Air Evac Lifeteam is the larg-
est independently owned and op-
erated membership-supported air 
medical service in the United 
States, conducting its operations 
through more than 89 bases mu-
tually-supporting air medical 
bases across 14 states. The com-
pany operates the world's largest 
fleet of more than 100 medically-
equipped Bell 206 Long Ranger 
helicopters and has safely flown 
more than 200,000 people who 
were in critical need of care. The 
Bell 206 Long Ranger helicopters 
are the safest in the industry and 
travel up to 150 mph. The pilots 
must follow FAA guidelines in or-
der to determine if weather con-
ditions are safe for any flight. They 
now use night vision goggles and 
the pilots are all commercially-cer-
tified to fly by instruments or visu-
ally. There are three crew mem-
bers on each flight-pilot, flight 
nurse and flight paramedic along 
with 1 patient at a time. The cur-
rent local service area includes 
operations in Oklahoma and 
Texas, including the entire pan-
handle of Texas. 

Air Evac Lifeteam, Eagle Med 
and Med Trans (DBA Northwest 
Texas Lifestar) are all now owned 
by the same parent company Air 
Medical Group Holdings (AMGH). 
Northwest Texas Lifestar does not 
currently have a membership pro-
gram. however, if you have the 
membership with Air Evac or 
Eagle Med your flight will be cov-
ered if flown by any of the 3 
(Northwest Texas Lifestar, Air 
Evac or Eagle Med). 

The average cost for a flight is 
around $20,000. Your member-
ship fee will cover the cost of the 
flight. To find out more information 
contact Christy Bell @ 580-497-
7992. 

1 Year Membership Prices: 

The Wheeler Chamber of Com-
merce is once again taking nomi-
nations for the 'Outstanding Indi-
viduals", who will be recognized 
at the annual Chamber of Com-
merce Installation Banquet. 

It is the desire of the Chamber 
to recognize the most deserving 
individuals in each of the catego-
ries. The public is being asked to 
nominate a man, woman and em-
ployee to be recognized. 

There are a number of men and 
women in our community, who 
give of their time for the 
community's benefit. Often time 
the number of people aware of 
their work is very small and they 
go unrecognized. The chamber 
would like for the awards to go to 
the most deserving and ask your 
help in identifying these individu- 

$50-1 person household 
$55-2 person household 
$60- household of 3 or more 
For additional information con-

tact: Christy Bell, Air Evac, EMS 
Inc., Membership Sales Manager-
Elk City OK-580.497.7992 

www.lifeteam.net or 
http://www.lifeteam.net/ 

We are committed to quality 
customer service by creating 
awareness in communities we 
serve to help minimize the finan-
cial burden to families who suffer 
medical emergencies," stated 
Bell. 

Trees Are Available 
Through Local SWCD 

The Wheeler County SWCD 
will be taking orders from now 
through February 26, 2010 for fruit 
and ornamental trees, shrubs and 
vines. 

Fruit trees sold in 5 gallon pots 
for $37 each are fuji apple, gala 
apple, golden delicious apple, 
granny smith apple, moorpark 
apricot, montmorency cherry and 
stella cherry. Chokecerry trees 
are in bareroot bundles of 25 for 
$43 per bundle. Nanking cherry 
shrubs and golden currant shrubs 
come in bareroot bundles of 25 for 
$43 per bundle. 

Ornamental trees of aristocrat 
flowering pear. Krauter Vesusius 
flowering plum and eastern red-
bud come in 5 gallon pots for $39 
each. 

Shrubs of dwarfed wing burn-
ing bush for $33 each, pink rose 
of sharon, purple rose of sharon. 
white rose of sharon for $30 each 
and Chinese wisteria for $31 each 
come in 5 gallon pots. Common 
lilac shrubs come in bareroot 
bundles of 25 for $43 per bundle. 

Grape vines of your choice of 
flame seedless red, himrod seed-
less white or mars seedless blue 
come in 2 gallon pots for $21 
each. 

If you would like to place an or-
der, please come by the Wheeler 
County SWCD office at 1410 S. 
Alan Bean Blvd., Wheeler, TX. 
Our office is open Monday 
through Friday from 8:00 a.m. to 
4:30 p.m. All orders must be paid 
for when you order. If you have 
any questions please. call 806-
826-3565 ext. 101. 

Backpacks For Kids 
In the small town of Clyde, TX, 

where most of the population live 
at or below the poverty level, the 
Backpacks for Kids program is 
making a difference. The program 
identifies food insecure kids with 
the help of their school system 
and discreetly delivers a backpack 
of food full of nutritious, kid-
friendly nonperishable items to 
these children each Friday. 
Rachel Laughlin connected with 
the Food Bank of West Central 
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may be taken to the chamber of-
fice at 505 S. Alan L. Bean Blvd 
in Wheeler; mailed to. Wheeler 
Chamber of Commerce, P.O. Box 
221, Wheeler, Texas 79096 or e-
mailed to kristi@wildlifetexas.com. 

The "Outstanding Teenager" 
and "Farmer/Rancher" will also be 
named; these are selected by 
committees. 

The banquet is scheduled for 
Saturday, February 27, 2010 at 
7:00 p.m. at the Wheeler County 
Ag and Family Center, N. Hwy. 83, 
Wheeler, Texas. Tickets will be 
available: make plans to be in at-
tendance. 

ALLISON 
NEWS 

By Juanita Boydston 

Rejoice in the Lord alway: and 
again I say, Rejoice. Let your 
moderation be known unto all 
men. The Lord is at hand. Be 
careful for nothing; but in every 
thing by prayer and supplication 
with thanksgiving let your re-
quests be made known unto God. 
And the peace of God, which 
passeth all understanding, shall 
keep your hearts and minds 
through Christ Jesus. 	Finally 
brethren, whatsoever things are 
true, whatsoever things are hon-
est, whatsoever things are just, 
whatsoever things are pure, what-
soever things are lovely, whatso-
ever things are of good report; if 
there be any virtue, and if there 
be any praise, think on these 
things. Those things, which ye 
have both learned, and received, 
and heard, and seen in me, do: 
and the God of peace shall be with 
you. But I rejoiced in the Lord 
greatly. that now at the last your 
care ofme hath flourished again 
wherein ye were also careful, but 
ye lacked opportunity. Not that I 
speak in respect of want: for I 
have learned in whatsoever state 
I am, therewith to be content. I 
know both how to be abased, and 
I know how to abound: every 
where and in all things I am in-
structed both to be full and to be 
hungary, both to abound and to 
suffer need. I can do all things 
through 	Christ,which 
strengtheneth me. Philippians 
4:4-13 

IT is a good thing to give thanks 
unto the Lord, and to sing praises 
unto thy name, 0 most High: To 
shew forth thy lovingkindness in 
the morning, and thy faithfulness 
every night. Upon an instrument 
of ten strings, and upon the psal-
tery: upon the harp with a solemn 
sound. For thou, Lord hast made 
me glad through thy work: I will 
triumph in thy works of thy hands. 
0 Lord, how great are thy works! 
and thy thoughts are very deep. 
Psalms 92.1-5 

The weather this Tuesday 
morning. PRAISE THE LORD for 
the SUNSHINE!! W have been 
socked in ice, snow and FOG for 
so long, it is so wonderful to have 
some sunshine. Don't matter that 
it is on ground hog day. So what 
if the ground hog sees his 
shadow, we are thankful for the 
sun. Thursday, the weather began 
with freezing rain and then 
changed to sleet and it kept that 
up for some time and then when 
ice was covered several inches 
thick over everything, then it came 
a blowing snow and we received 
drifts of snow everywhere on top 
of the ice. But THANK the LORD 
that we didn't lose our electricity!! 
God is so good to us. But after 
five days of no sun, it makes you 
so thankful and grateful for the 
sun. Praise be to Jesus!! 

On January 22 and 23rd. Bret 
Begert was in Austin, Texas for 
Board of Directors Meeting for the 
Texas Assoication of School 
Boards. Bret represents Ft. Elliott 
CISD and all sixty three school 
districts in the Texas Panhandle 
on that board. 

Tuesday, Opal and Juanita 
Boydston did some shopping in 
Wheeler, Texas and picked up 
some medicine for Peggy Chan-
dler. 

Wednesday, Curtis and Lillian 
Boydston vistied in the home of 
Opal and Juanita Boydston. 

Wednesday afternoon. Juanita 
Boydston visited in the home of 
Vance and Carol Boydston and 
watched the State of Union ad-
dress given by our president, 
Obama. They had refreshments 
and a good visit. 

Then of course everything 
came to a screeching halt as we 
received our ice storm and blow-
ing snow. No one went anywhere 
for a while, especially on Thurs-
day. WOW!! What a storm we 
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CONTINUE EDUCATION: The Ora Belinda SchoolHouse Early Learn- 
ging Center Team Members continue their Early Childhoodraining by 
'attending the PAEYC (Panhandle Association for Education of Young 

Children) Conference in Amarillo, TX on Saturday, January 23, 2010. 
Those attending included: Rebecca Orient, Chris Clayton. Elizabeth 
Couch, Ann Porter, and Krystle Brady(not pictured) 

will be conducted by the County 
Clerks office only. Applications for 
ballots need to be MAILED to 
Margaret Dorman, Wheeler 
County Clerk, Box 465, Wheeler, 
Texas 79096. The last day to 
apply by mail is February 23, 
2010. Must be received by County 
Clerks office on this day. 

The requirements are: 
1. Each person has to applhe reasons why the individual 

and sign their own separate ap- should receive the award. 

plication. All nominations will be consid- 

2. Each application must aced by the committees appointed 

mailed separately. 	 to select the respective individu- 

3. If the applicant is not ovePls to be named. 
65, the ballot must be mailed out- 	It is necessary that the nomina- 

side the county, unless confined tions be returned by 5:00 p.m. 
in a hospital or care facility 	February 18, 2010. Nominations 

Wheeler and Shamrock City Hall als. 
in Shamrock beginning February 	You as a boss, co-worker or 
16 and ending February 26, customer know of someone who 

2010. 	 goes out of their way to be friendly, 
Early Voting by mail for those helpful and informative in perform-

absent from the county or over 65 ing their duties at their job. Once 
again the 'chamber' may not be 
aware: fill out an application form 
and nominate a deserving em-
ployee. 

The chamber has placed appli-
cation form at different locations 
around town for anyone to nomi-
nate the person they feel most 
deserving. Please make your 
ideas known and remember to list 

Air Evac Mete= Presentation 
Made At Lions Club Meetiing 



OLD TIMES NOT FORGOTTEN 
By Roland Miles 

 

    

SHOOTIN' FROM THE HIP 
% NEWS 

By Verna Fillingim 

THESE PICTURES SPONSORED BY: 

FIRST STATE BANK 
Mobeetie Office: 
First & Wheeler St. 
Blvd. 
Mobeetie, Texas 

845-2311 

Wheeler Office: 
1408 S. Alan Bean 

Wheeler, Texas 
826-5546 

Sarina Alvarado & Michael Shortnacy are playing Air Hockey. 

LION'S DEN!!! The PK students look forward to playing in the 
Lion's Den at the end of each 6 weeks. They do their best to 
collect as much Lion Loot as possible during the 6 weeks so 
they will get to enter the Lion's Den. They have fun playing board 
games, air hockey. and bowling on the Wii. It's a great experi-
ence and the students have so much fun playing the games to-
gether. Each 6 weeks they get better at playing the games and 
bowling. 

Right Serenity Mendez is playing bowling on the Wii. 
- 	- 

Left: Tanner Reynolds, Aaron 
Perez, and Donovan McDermett 

The Kelton ISD students in the 
photos shared are participating in 
the "Lions Den Program." The 
students earn -Lion Loot" which 
busy time in the game room. Stu-
dents must turn in completed 
homework, get to class on time, 
etc. 

Below: Cecilia Guerero, Rachel 
Blackburn. Reonna Dyck, Cody 
Stephenson, Felisha Butler, and 
Vanessa Scales 

First United Methodist Church 
Eighth at Main St. - P.O. Box 89 

Wheeler, TX 79096 
(806) 826-3114 - Fax 826-3780 
wheelerumc4 windstream.net 

Tom Carter, Pastor 

Sunday Schedule: 
Donuts & Coffee: 9:30 A.M. 
Sunday School: 9:45 A M. 

Morning Worship: 11:00 A.M. 

Vil
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20 plus yrs 
All Work 
Insured 
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Experience 
Guaranteed 

& Bonded 

Wellington,  

Metal Roofing 
Flat / Built-Up 
Composition 

Permakote Wood 
Texas  
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--r Free Estimates TOMO] 

(806)205-0800 

Outlaw 

806.334.0798 

"Dirt 

Skid 

Roost 

Trackhoe 

Farming 

Dozer 

or 

Work" 

Steer 

806.845.3008 

Equipment 

* 

* 

paycii  

Rasco 

* Steel 

Overhead 

Custom 

1211 
806 665-0042—Phone 

* 

S Price 

Frame 

rascodooq&live.com 

Storage 
Insulation 

Garage 

Road, 
806 

Construction 
Pampa, 

Carports 

665-0043—Fax 

Door 

TX 

Buildings 

Kevin Jefferis 886-2055 	 Tim Sexton 440-1491 

MARSHALL'S 

HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING • 
WHEELER, TX—PHONE: 664-5395—CELL: 662-7876 

NOW DOING .. 
TRAM , AIR DUCT CLEANING  

It s Hold To Stop A To alle —24 Hour Emergency Service— 

LICENSED & INSURED 
License No. TAGLB022710E 

Mark Marshall, Owner 

Help Wanted 
Hugoton,KS manufacturer is looking for motivated individual 
with good work ethic for employment in Wheeler/Gray 
County, Texas area for the following position: 

Mechanic for Natural Gas Compressors 

This position requires mechanical experience in compressor 
and engine repair. 
Automotive and/or diesel experience is appreciated, training 
will be provided. The ability to work independently is 
mandatory. Applicant must have a clean driving record and 
must provide own tools. Pay proportionate to experience. 
Position is full time employment with benefits. Great Plains 
Gas Compression, Inc. offers a competitive employment 
package, including insurance and 401(k) plan. A pre-
employment physical and drug screen are required. 
Applications or resumes may be faxed to the Great Plains 
Gas Compression office (620) 544-4141 or call 620/544-4191 
for more information. 
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After going to as many cowboy 
picture shows that I did as a kid; I 
couldn't help but notice some 
things that consistently happened 
to "Gene Autry" and "Roy Rogers." 

In nearly every movie, they'd be 
clippidy-cloppin' along, having a 
really nice day; so nice... that they 
would break out singing. Just 
about the time they finished their 
song, without fail, there'd be some 
bad guy. hidin' behind big rocks 
close to the road, who would start 
shooting at them. He obviously, 
wasn't a music lover. in addition 
to being a poor shot with a pistol. 

Pretty soon, the bad guy would 
run out of bullets, jump on his 
horse, and tear down the road, 
dust a flying. Roy or Gene, would 
always catch up with him; right 
where the steep, sandy, bank was 
at the edge of the road. He'd jump 
from "ole Trigger," or "ole Cham-
pion." grab the bad guy, and both 
would tumble down the sandy 
bank. When they stopped rolling, 
they'd jump up and start swinging 
fists! The bad guy always lost, and 
got taken to jail. 

The other shows that were just 
as consistent, was where the 
wagon train was surrounded by 
Indians. The cavalry always came 
tearing up on their horses, bugles 
blaring. and saved the day! The 
only one I ever saw where the 
cavalry lost, was a movie about 
"General Custer." Several times, 
there'd be a cavalry man, that 
would shoot his rifle from the hip, 
because he didn't have time to put 
it up to his shoulder. This scene, 
began to set me thinking... 

This "hip shootin"' might be a  

good technique for me to master, 
just in case a coyote jumped out 
of the bushes, and I didn't have 
time to get my .22 up to my 
shoulder...Yep, I'd give it a try. 

It didn't turn out to be as easy 
as I'd thought, but I did take ev-
ery opportunity to practice. The 
way I liked best, was to turn about 
ninety degrees away from what-
ever I was going to shoot at, then 
spin around and let it have it... I 
really should have stuck with tin 
cans, pie melons, and dirt clods. 

One day, I whirled around and 
shot at the fender of an old, model 
"A" or model "T" car, that was ly-
ing on its side behind our barn. 
The bullet slid around the inside 
of the fender, came right back, and 
hit me just below my belt! It sort 
of stung a lithe, but since I'd never 
been shot before, I didn't know 
just how bad, getting shot was 
supposed to hurt. 

I stood there for a few seconds, 
to see if I was going to start bleed-
ing. After not seeing any blood, I 
looked to see if there was a bullet 
hole in my pants, but there 
wasn't... 

When I finally raked up the 
nerve to pull my britches down 
and look, there was only a small 
pink spot where I got hit. Then I 
looked on the ground and right 
there in front of me, was the bul-
let. 

It was kind of flattened-out look-
ing. I put it in my pocket and kept 
it as a souvenir for a long time. 
This was yet another lesson, 
learned by bad judgment and 
good luck; don't shoot at metal 
things! 

"What a mighty God we serve! 
Angels bow before Him: Heaven 
and Earth adore Him...What a 
mighty God we serve!" 

"Happy Birthday" to Lonny 
Kenney, Doyle Pond, Seth 
McClellan, Kevin Shields, Noah 
Singleton, and Duane Bradford, 
Jan. 31; Dean Lane. Amanda 
Childress, Jackie Lane, Jacob 
Swigart, and Mike Westbrooks, 
Feb. 1; Madison Shields, Daniel 
Schmid, Devin Diebel McDaniel, 
Daniel Benefield, Jace Brooks, 
Cathi Gillette. Shelley Hudgins. 
Jack Norman, and Mark Whitaker, 
Feb. 1; Jamey James, Justin 
Bryant. Kay Stiles, Brett 
Buckingham, Emma Fain, Mary 
Jones, Josh Hardcastle, Nick 
Hardcastle, David King, Jessica 
Masters, Andy King. Rachel 
Reimes, Dan Trimble, Melinda 
Wharton, Micala Bailey and Ray 
Brazeal, Feb. 2: Gavin Boydston, 
Matt Johnson, John Shields, Jean 
Jenner, Tom Bible, Sonya 
Hudson, Carol DeArment, Bobbie 
Emmert, Brittney Robinson, Jaret 
Moore, Cory Barr, Tess Markham 
and DeAnna Vandiver, Feb. 4: 
Dense Atwood, Jim Calderon, 
Juanita Stas. Shelby Jones, 
Sherilyn Toelle, Cindy Bradstreet 
and Shirley Jolly, Feb. 5 and Kandi 
Jones, Feb. 6. 

"Happy Anniversary-  to Joe and 
Sherry Wagoner, Feb 1, Bobbie 
and Micah Edwardo, Feb. 2; 
Eddie and Jodie Hughes, Feb. 3 
and Jackie Don and Kellie May, 
Feb. 5 

Graveside funeral services at 
Kelton Cemetery for Hawk Ails. 
Wheeler, were Monday with  

Wheeler Methodist Church serv-
ing dinner at the Kelton School for 
the family and friends. Sincere 
sympathy to the family. Many 
there. 

Joyce Walker was moving her 
mom, Vera Crane, into Wheeler 
Care Center Tuesday at her 
mom's request. Go by and greet 
this sweet lady. Hope she'll enjoy 
the fellowship and activities and 
other people. God bless you, 
Vera. See you soon. Vera seems 
to like it O.K. at the Care Center. 
Girls are sending cookies to sol-
diers if you want to help. 

Coming to church at Care Cen-
ter Tuesday morning were Mark 
Barton. Joyce Wood. Earl and 
Betty Hustead, Martha Meek and 
Verna for good sing-along, mes-
sage from the Bible by Earl and 
prayers for all. May God bless you 
all! 

Girl Scouts are getting money 
together to send cookies to 
troops. Want to help? 

Howdy to William and Annette 
Newman and family in Alabama. 
Hope all is well with all of you. 

Some residents out to Care 
Church Tuesday were Dorothy 
Walker, Marie Baker, Rosalee 
Atwood. Bill Dyson, Stanley, Edith 
Adams, Wayne Stanton, Robert 
Airstik, Rosalie Keelin and others 
to hear the good singing and mes-
sages. 

Gene and Vickey Ferguson vis-
ited her daughter and husband in 
Montana. They got back Friday, 
but had to rest up a little. Lots of 
snow in Montana and hear much 
is expected in Texas! No thanks. 
We missed Gene and Vickey at 
church at Wheeler Baptist. Glad 
you are back! 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Betty Jean Lewis, 80, 
of Wellington in her death. Ser-
vices Wednesday at Methodist 
Church in Wellington. Betty was 
married to my cousin, Carthel 
Lewis, who was also a cousin to 
Jimmy Morgan of Wheeler. Betty 
was also preceded in death by a 
son, seven brothers and a sister 
I used to enjoy playing with 
Carthel and his brother, Tommy, 
many years ago or visiting his 
mom, Aunt Johnnie. Johnnie 
Lewis was my mom's sister. 

Dolores Simmons and 
Stephanie Jones prepared the 
good Wednesday night supper 
and many people there to enjoy it 
at Wheeler Baptist Church. Thank 
you! Some others brought des-
serts. Visitors always welcome. 
God bless you all! 

David and Rita Pearson went 
to Amarillo and Canyon one day 
to see Dagen, 5 yrs., play basket-
ball at half time of a basketball 
game. Dagen enjoyed it so much 
that he did not want to quit. 
Sounds like fun! 

Trees here at Wheeler are cov-
ered with ice. So thankful that we 
still have our electricity and a 
warm place and food. I don't plan 
to venture out. This Monday is my 
5th day in, but am thankful for a 
warm place. Some cars still mov-
ing in spite of the sleet and snow 
on the ground. Thank you to those 
who venture out to care for oth-
ers. 

MOBEEIrlE 
NEWS 
By Sue Mayfield 

01' Mother Nature certainly got 
her point across this last week. 
We believe it now. It is definitely 
winter. The only time I could have 
cared 	less 	if 	the 
weather forecasters turned out to 
be way to right to suit me, Thanks 
to them though, we all were bet-
ter prepared for the snow of 2010. 
That's what many are calling it. I 
hope they are right and that was 
the worst we will get.The white 
stuff was beautiful, but sure made 
it hard on alot of people. The rum-
blings of thunder sure got some 
peoples attention. In South Da-
kota the area Indians said that 6 
months after the first thunder in a 
new year there would be a hard 
freeze. I sure hope that the Texas 
and Oklahoma Indians have bet-
ter news for us,or we will be get-
ting a freeze in June, after all 
those hard working gardeners 
have a beautiful start on an abun-
dant harvest. Thank the good Lord 
and the electric company guys. 
We got through the whole thing 
with just a few good flickers and 
then it was just set and watch 
it sleet and snow We were very 
fortunate and only got a good 
base of ice and sleet and then just 
a few inches of snow. compared 
to the 8"-16" in other parts. People 
in part of Oklahoma weren't quite 
as fortunate as we were. Part of 
Lawton has been with out electric-
ity since last Thurs. nite. Tanya 
Stuart's offices at the Merry Maids 
building has been out the whole 
time. Wal-Mart is on. The Stuart 
family had electricity the whole 
time. Jarid's house is in Marlow 
and has been out the whole time. 
so he has been staying with Mom 
and Dad. Nanny and Todd. They 
got the electricity on at Duncan so 
Chad and his family have been 
host to Sheena's family until they 
can get the electricity on at their 
house. Sheena' s little brother is 
just about the same age as her 
oldest son, so all the boys all think 
that this camping out at the house 
is pretty cool. 

Poor Harley, I'm afraid she got 
(Continued Page 5) 

Hear the 
"Abundant Living Broadcast" 

KM-FM, 90.5 
WHEELER, TEXAS 

Saturdays: 9:00 a m. to Noon 

Thank you to city guys with 
maintainers who are working to 
make it better. They have cleared 
a lot of snow and sleet off and 
dumped it in the field north. 
Thanks, Wes Bradstreet! 

Briscoe Fire Department was 
called to help monitor a wreck Fri-
day night when a vehicle slid on 
ice and someone was injured. An 
ambulance out of Canadian was 
also there to help transport a lady 
from Perryton who was injured. 
Hope all will be all right. Think it 
happened on Holland Hill. 

Leona Coates enjoyed a recent 
visit from daughter, Lee Ann 
Brown, from Krum and grand-
daughter, Amber, from Denison. 
Nice to have them all out to church 
and our Sunday School class. 
Come back soon! They all also 
visited Preston and Elsie Glazner 
for a good visit with their relatives. 

It sleeted and snowed Thursday  

and ground still covered on Mon- • 
day. What thick fog!,„and sleet! I 
haven't been out except to get 
Amarillo paper at garage door. 

So nice to have a phone call 
from long-time special friend, 
Peggy Thompson, from Olathe, 
Kansas. Peggy and Dennis Th-
ompson lived for a time at 
Wheeler and then at the gas plant 
in our area and had two boys. Jeff 
and Kelley, who attended Briscoe 
School. They all came to Gageby 
Church and we enjoyed fellowship 
with them. They still get the 
Wheeler Times. God bless you 
everyone! Peggy loves fixing hair 
and has her own beauty shop in 
Kansas five days a week. Hope 
all is well! Their address is 16261 
S. Warnirck, Olathe, Kansas 
66062. Peggy's mom even reads • 
the Wheeler Times. Sweet lady. 

"God be with you till we meet 
again." 
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Need cash? 
%Ile turn the "stuff" 

vou don't use into the 
cash you need. 

202-3039 ur 202-8128 
www.webay.info 

WIN TOURNAMENT: The Alpha Omega Academy Junior High "A" team took home the 1st Place Cham- 
pionship Trophy from the TCS Jr. High Basketball Tournament in Hous- ,--- 	 -\,, 
ton on Saturday, January 23rd. The AOA Lady Lions were undefeated ' WHEELER in this three-day, double elimination tournament. Pictured here (back 
row,-I. to r.) are Kendall Coburn, Dorcie Gillette, Coach Andy Flack. 
and Coach Stan Straughan, (front) Bailey Wakefield, Destiny PLUMBING 
Monteagudo. Robbi Flack, Naomi Harsh,Sarah Heaton, Naomi 
Straughan, Annie Smith, Katie Vincent, and Courtney Wyatt. 	 511 S. Cheyenne 

WHEELER NURSING & 
REHABILITATION, LP 

806.826.3505 
Rehabilitation • Skilled Nursing 

Long & Short Term Care 
Medicare, Medicaid Approved 

"Your Loved Ones Deserve The Best" 

1000 S. Kiowa • Wheeler, TX 79096 

New Construction 
Remodel 
Repair 

Sewer Service 
Septic Systems 
Site Evaluations 

Phone: 826-5907 
MAX McQUEEN 

, P.O. Box 754 Wheeler, TX 

Ammunition Available: 
25-06 REM 90GR HP 
270 WIN 130GR SST INTERLOCKT 
270 WIN 130GR SP 
270 WIN 150GR SPRN 
270 WIM SM 130GR SP 
30-06 SPRG 150GR POWER-POINT 
30-06 SPRG 165GR SP 
30-06 SPRG 165GR PSP 
30-06 SPRG 180GR SP 
30-06 SPRG 180GR POWER-POINT 
30-30 WIM 150GR CORE-LOKT SP 
30-30 WIM 170GR POWER-POINT 
308 WIM PSP BT 
7MM REM MAG 174GR PSP BT 
7MM REM MAG 150GR POWER-POINT 
9MM 115GR FMJ 

9MM 147GR FMJ 
40 S&W 170GR FMJ 
40 S&W 180GR FMJ 
45 AUTO 185GR JHP 
45 AUTO 2000R SWC 
45 AUTO 230GR FMJ 
22 LR WIN WILDCAT 
22 LR REM THUNDEBOLT 
22 LR AGUILA SUPEREXTRA 
17 HMR 17GR V-MAX 
22-250 REM 55GR PSP 
220 SWIFT 50GR PSP 
223 REM 62GR FMJ 
223 REM 55GR FMJ-BT 
223 REM 55GR FMJ 
243 WIN 100GR CORE-LOKT PSP 
25-06 REM 100GR CORE-LOKT PSP 

Temporary, part-time 
jobs now available. 

Census Takers 
Crew Leaders 

Crew Leader Assts. 
Recruiting Assts. 

Census Clerks 

Census jobs offer: 
✓ flexible hours up to 4O/wk 
✓ mileage reimbursement 
v work near home 

You may qualify if you: 
are 18 or older 
have a valid SSN 

V pass a background check 
take a written test 
can work up to 40 Firs 
per week in the evening 
and on weekends 

www.2010censusjobs.gov 
1-866-861-2010 

The U.S. Census. Bureau ,s an 
Equal Opportordtv Employer. 

NRCS Can Offer Financial Assistance 

• 

1$ 

• 

• 

• 

List of instruments filed in the 
Wheeler County Clerk's office 
from January 20, 2010 -
January 26, 2010. 

OL-Huberta A. Powell to Bob J.  
Weatherly, 1-12-10. SE/4 Sec. 
25, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Achsa Blake Brothers to Bob 
J. Weatherly, 1-12-10, SE/4 Sec. 
25, Blk. A-8. H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Leo C. Lee Revocable Trust, 
et al to Bob J. Weatherly, 1-12- 

10, N/2 SW/4. Sec. 25, Blk. A-8. 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-Gene B. Caperton Trust. et al 
to Chesapeake Exploration LLC, 
11-17-09, NE/4; SW/4 Sec. 5, Blk. 
1, Brooks & Burleson Survey; NI 
2 Sec. 7, Blk. 2, Brooks & 
Burleson Survey. 
DT-Jana Whaley Gregory to 
National Bank of Commerce, 1- 

0 

11-10, Pts. Sec. 32, Blk. A-5, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
SHERIFFS DEED-Shamrock 
ISD. et al to Bo Rawlins, 12-11- 
9, 7.26 acs. Sec. 39, Blk. 17, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN.-Apache Corporation to 
Sanguine Gas Exploration LLC, 
1-7-10, SE/4 Sec. 19, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
PARTIAL ROL-Sanguine Gas 
Exploration LLC, et al to Steven 
Bradley Hale, et al, 10-15-08, 
See Instrument. 
OL-B. Steven Dearien to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 11-9-09, Sec. 2, 
Blk. H, W. H. Simpson Survey. 
OL-David H. Dearien to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc . 
11-9-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Rita Smith to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
23-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Rick Dearien to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
23-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Sandye L. Allen to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 
11-9-09. Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-E. Imogene Walters, et al to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 9-23-09, Sec. 2, 
Blk. H, W. H. Simpson Survey. 
OL-Janice Norman to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
10-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Barbara Dearien to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
23-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Verda Carter Franz to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 9-18-09, Sec. 2. 
Blk. H, W. H. Simpson Survey. 
OL-Barbara Jane Fortenberry to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 10-26-09, S/2 
Sec. 54. Blk. A-4, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
OL-Shiela Brewer to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
16-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Benny Risner to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
9-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
OL-Barbara Jane Fortenberry to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 10-26-09, S/2 
Sec. 54, Blk. A-4, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
OL-William E. Lancaster 
Testamentary Trust to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 
11-17-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
JANUARY 20, 2010 
OL-Melody Welty Jones to Bob 
J. Weatherly, 11-7-09, S/2 Sec. 
30, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Phyllis A. Tucker to Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Continent Inc., 9-
16-09, Sec. 2, Blk. H, W. H. 
Simpson Survey. 
MEMORANDUM OL-Billy Wayne 
Finsterwald to PAC Production 
Company, 1-16-10, Pt. Sec. 3, 
Blk. H, W. H. Simpson and Pt. S. 
A. Stephens Survey. 
MEMORANDUM OL-Doris Fay 
Finsterwald to PAC Production 
Company, 1-16-10, Pt. Sec. 3, 
Blk. H, W. H. Simpson and Pt. S. 
A. Stephens Survey. 
MEMORANDUM OL-Bobby 
Gene Finsterwald to PAC 
Production Company, 1-16-10, 
Pt. Sec. 3, Blk. H, W. H. Simpson 
and Pt. S. A. Stephens Survey. 
CORR. D-R. L. Zybach, et ux to 
Melody R. Goad, 12-4-09, Sec. 
14. Camp County School Land. 
CORR. D-R. L. Zybach, et ux to 
Royce W. Zybach, 12-4-09, Sec. 
10, Camp County School Land 
ROW-Gary Hall, et ux to Enbridge 
Pipelines (Texas Gathering) LP, 
1-15-10, Pt. Sec. 25, Camp 
County School Land. 
ROW-Gary Hall, et ux to Enbridge 
Pipelines (Texas Gathering) LP. 
1-15-10, Pt. Sec. 25, Camp 
County School Land. 
ROW-Gary Hall, et ux to Enbridge 
Pipelines (Texas Gathering) LP, 
1-15-10, Pt. Sec. 25, Camp 
County School Land. 
ASSIGN. BS CONVEY.-Barker 
Production Co. to Barker 
Production Co. LP, 1-19-10, See 
Instrument, 
JANUARY 21, 2010 
ASSIGN. DEED BS-Oak Valley 
Mineral and Land LP, et al to 
Noble Royalties Access Fund IV 
LP, 12-28-09, See Instrument. 
HOME EQUITY DT- Jimmy 
Morgan. et ux to SunTrust 
Mortgage Inc., 1-14-10. N 20' Lot 
10 and all of Lots 11 and 12, Blk. 
3, Vise Sub.-Div., Wheeler. 
HOME EQUITY AFF.- Jimmy 
Morgan, et ux to SunTrust 
Mortgage Inc., 1-14-10, N 20' Lot 
10 and all of Lots 11 and 12, Blk. 
3, Vise Sub.-Div., Wheeler. 
ASSIGN. BS CONVEY.-
Shamrock Oil and Gas Inc. to 
Natural Gas Futures Inc., 1-19-
10, Sec. 4, J. Poitevent Survey. 
ASSIGN.-ASEM Company to 
Zephyr Operating Co. LLC. 1-12-
10, Pt. Sec. 2, Blk. 2, Brooks & 
Burleson Survey. 
ROW-Stiles Land Assets Ltd. to 
Enogex Gas Gathering LLC, 12-
22-09. Pt. SE/4 Sec. 68, Blk. A-
7. H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 

ROW-Boyd Huff to Enogex Gas 
Gathering LLC, 12-21-09. Pt. SE/ 
4 Sec. 33, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
STL-State of Texas to Buddy's 
Country Store, 1-15-10. 
SHERIFFS DEED-City of 
Shamrock, et al to City of 

NRCS (Natural Resources 
Conservation Service) is a branch 
of the USDA that provides land-
owners and operators with tech-
nical and financial assistance to 
implement conservation practices 
on their land. There is a local 
NRCS office in almost every 
county in the state of Texas. The 
local NRCS office for Wheeler 
County is located at 1410 S. Alan 
Bean Boulevard in Wheeler. 

One of the more common con-
servation practices installed in 
Wheeler County is a watering fa-
cility for livestock. Through work-
ing with the landowner or opera-
tor, NRCS can design and size a 
watering facility based on the  

Shamrock, et al, 12-11-09, Pt. 
135' x 150' Outlot 28, Shamrock. 
RDT-Wells Fargo Bank NA to 
Sterling M. Sloss, et ux, 1-11-10, 
W/2 Lot 3: E 1/3 Lot 2 and W 75' 
S 50' Lot 4, Blk. 38, Shamrock. 
JANUARY 22, 2010 

(Continued Page 4) 

financial support is through the 
Environmental Quality Incentives 
Program (EQIP). EQIP offers fi-
nancial assistance to help offset 
some of the costs to install con-
servation practices. Eligibility for 
EQIP assistance can be deter-
mined at the local NRCS field of-
fice. If an applicant meets eligi-
bility and an EQIP contract is 
signed. the landowner or opera-
tor typically has 12 months to 
complete the installation of the 
watering facility. For any ques-
tions, please stop by our office or 
give us a call at (806)826-
3565ext:3. 
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I t 's In Our Hands 

Firearms, Ammunition & 

Reloading Supplies 

602 Cheyenne • Wheeler, IX 

806.826.0129 • 806.898.0916 

A Selection of Guns in Stock! 
mal 	robschaf@windstream net 

• Selection of Ammunition in stock. 
• Check with me if you have difficulty finding 
• Soon to have guns in stock! 

Robby Schaffer 

ammunition 

Apply Now! 
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will support. Typical trough sizes 
range from 2x1Oft through 2x24ft. 

,- 	I I 
	1111(5.I.  

' 	HI  I 1 .'-',;.-...-.'  '  FIDELITY 
Watering facilities that are eligible 
for cost share assistance can be 
made from concrete, concrete 
with steel, or fiberglass. 	The fa- 
cility must be installed according 
to NRCS standards and specifi-
cations which will be explained to 
the landowner or operator at the 
time of application. 

Once the conservation practice 
has been installed correctly, 
NRCS will provide the landowner 
or operator with a percentage of 
the installation costs. 	One of the 
ways NRCS can offer producers 
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GIFTS - CARLTON CARDS 
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M-F, 8:30-Noon Sat 

-WHEELER, TEXAS 	Fity_„, 
git 
5 Phone: 

WEDDING/BABY SHOWER REGISTRY 

No 
Pampa 
806-669-6062 

Credit 
• 

Buy 
Check 
Corner 

• 

Here 
• 

D,904-j8,,r9i sairlc!)  

Areas 
/ 

of 

Pay 

Hwy 
Lan 

www.dougboydmotors.com 

Here 

60 @ Hwy 
est Selection 

70 

___ 

28+ 

Your 

(Pol.  ad paid for  

Gary 
Wheeler 

Commissioner, 

Years 

Vote 

by Gary Davis, 

• --.., 

_ASTS.-Aftga.  

Dedicated 

Elect 

Davis 
County 

Pct. 2 

4  

Experience 

Appreciated 

PO. Box 66, Wheeler, TX 790961 



ROYALTY OWNER 
SERVICES 

ARE YOU RECEIVING YOUR PROPER 
SNARE OF OIL AND GAS SALES? 

We Provide: 
* Accounting and Accuracy of Payment 

Verification 
Accuracy of High Cost Severance Tax 

Charges 
* Identification, Resolution and Collection of 

Royalty Payment Errors. Provided on 
either an Ongoing or Project Basis. 

Local References Available Upon Request. 

Call Toll Free 1-800-658-7168 

John McNab - Enercept, Inc 

* 

Tne following is a list of political 
offices open for election and the 
names of individuals who have 
announced in The Wheeler 
Times their having placed their 
names on the ballot for the March 
Primary 

Democratic Primary 
For County Judge 
Jerry Hefley 

For Co. Commissioner. Pet 
Gary Davis 
Dean Lax 
Bob Hink 

For Co. Treasurer 
Jauna Benefield 

For Justice of the Peace, pet., 
Nikki Hathaway 

(Subject to the action of the voters in the 
Democratic Primary, Tuesday. March 2. 
2010 

Republican Primary 
For District Judge 
Steven R. Emmert 

For Co. Commissioner, pc,. 
Dale Clawson 

For Co. Treasurer 
Nancy Emmert 

For Justice of the Peace, pri 
Mark Brown 
Liz Austin 

(Subject to the action of the voters in the 
Republican Primary. Tuesday, March 2. 
2010 

Vote in the March 2 Primary 
(Paid for by each of the political candidates 
listed as pan of the Political Announcement 
which ran elsewhere in the paper.) 

TEA 
MEMBER 

2009 
TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

STOP LEG CRAMPS 
BEFORE THEY STOP YOU.  

Calcet' is designed to help stop low calcium leg 

cramps. Just ask your pharmacist. 

0) 
Helps tight 
leg cramps 

Fights 
with milk allergies osteoporosis 

For most 
Mission 

Petite Tablet 
wilt' More Calcium 

& Vitamin 03 

Calcet 

DIRECTV SAVE $26/MO FOR A YEAR! 
PLUS: 

FREE 1-4 Room System 

FREE Standard Installation 1-4 Rooms 

FREE HD/DVR Receiver Upgrade! 

FREE 3 MONTHS SHOWTIME & STARZ 
,nth Crete /aft/MA Package and  An 

No start costs! Local Installs! 
ASK HOW! CALL DIRECTSTARTV 

Toll Free 1-800-214-7110 

NOW 
FREE 

MOVIES! DIRECTV 
AUTHORIZED DEALER 

• 
Want Ads THE WHEELER TIMES 
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City Drug Bed & Breakfast Ho-
tel New Year Special!!! Jan.-
March: Stay two nights at regular 
room rate and get the third night 
free. Our rates start at $79 plus 
tax with breakfast included. 
Bad weather rate $69 plus tax, 
single or double occupancy. Call 
for details. 806/826-3790 

1/28-2/4c oi Whe 	
tts100 

at( planned 

05Celeb
tatotA   

pa: ,0 Lovegrass Hay For Sale Anhy-
drous: Call 375-2578 or 806-679- 
8891. 	 1/21rtn 

Hunting Lease Wanted: Just lost 
long time lease. Small Group/ 
Family looking for year around, 
long term lease. Local Refer-
ences available. I live in Atlanta. 
Ga. Management minded hunt-
ers. Call 404-456-8328 

1/14-4/1c 

P.O. Box 1080 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 
Phone: 806/826-3123 

Entered as se flit-class matter December 18, 1933. at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Postmaster: Send Address changes to The Wheeler Times. 
P.O. Box 1080, Wheeler. TX 79096-1080 — 

mjnesecentrarnedia net 

Louis C. Stas, Owner & Publisher 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Wheeler County S20.00 Outside County S2200 

• 
Monntain-Cedar 

Fence Posts, T-Posts, 
Stays, Barbwire, and 
Oak or Mesquite Fire 

Wood 
Butch McBee 

806/455-1310 or 

806/346-1105 
If no answer, leave a message. 

thru July 

FREE: Sears King Size Mattress 
Set. Very clean. 806-826-5958 

FOR SALE: Registered Angus 
Cattle. Two-year-old bulls, year-
ling bulls, spring calving heifers 
and yearling heifers. 7-H Angus 
Cattle, Wheeler, TX Phone 806-
633-0558 or 806-826-3358. 
Email: 
sevenhangus@aol.com 1/17rtn 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
Notice is hereby given that origi-

nal Letters of Administration for 
the Estate of John Mann, De-
ceased, were issued on January 
15, 2010, under Docket No. 3577 
pending in the County Court of 
Wheeler County, Texas to DOUG 
WARE. 

Claims may be presented in 
care of the attorney for the estate, 
addressed as follows: 

Doug Ware, Administrator 
Estate of John Mann, 

Deceased 
do Don R. Lane 
P.O. Box 1781 
Pampa, TX 79066-1781 

All persons having claims 
against his estate, which is cur-
rently being administered, are re-
quired to present them within the 
time and in the manner prescribed 
by law. 

Dated January 25, 2010. 
Doug Ware 

#1770 Hobart Ranch, 50' from 
South & 1250' from East line, Sec. 
70, A-2, H&GN, PD 12800'. 
ROBERTS (MORRISON RANCH 
Upper Morrow 9470') Davis Op-
erating Inc., #3183A Morrison, 
660' from South & East line, Sec. 
183, 42, H&TC, PD 9700'. 
ROBERTS (PAN-PETRO Cleve-
land) Mewbourne Oil Co.. #1451H 
Wilson. 457' from South & 467' 
from East line, Sec. 145, 13, 
T&NO, PD 8900' (BHL: 467' from 
North & East Sec. line) Horizon-
tal 
WHEELER (BUFFALO WALLOW 
Granite Wash) Devon Energy Pro-
duction Co. L.P., #2012H Bach, 
200' from South & 660' from East 
line, Sec. 12, RE, CCSL, PD 
14000' (BHL: 375' from North & 
660' from East Sec. Line) Horizon-
tal 
WHEELER (WILDCAT & MILLS 
RANCH Atoka) Sanguine Gas 
Exploration L.L.C. #2036 
Davidson, 1800' from South & 
1846' from West line, Sec. 36, Blk. 
A-7, H&GN, PD 16900'. 
Recompletion 
Plugged Wells 
ROBERTS (WILDCAT) Latigo 
Petroleum Inc., #1 Hayhook 
Ruidosa, Sec. 154, B-2, I&GN, 
spud 10-9-08, plugged 11-5-08, 
TD 9850' (dry) — 
WHEELER (EAST PANHANDLE) 
Basa Resources Inc., #201 
Reneau, Sec. 2, 24, J.M. Carpen-
ter, spud 4-21-06, plugged 4-28-
06. TD 170' (dry) -- 

100' SE/4 Sec. 4, 81k. A-3, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
LEASE-Stiles Land Assets Ltd. to 
Centerpoint Energy Field 
Services Inc., 10-29-09, 100' x 
100' NW/4 Sec. 68, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 

THE 
BUSINESS DIRECTORY  
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* 24 Hi Gas & [Nese; * Convenience Sture 
* Hunt Bros. Pizza 

301 E. Oklahoma St. 

Phone:W8761-826  

Tx 
26-2276 

Dale, Monica & Rachel Kldd 

Oil & Gas 
NEWS Parkview Hospital is now accept-

ing applications for full time ward 
clerk for the 7pm to 7am shift. 
Competitive salary and excellent 
benefit Package. Please call Sue 
Stiles,CNO @ 826-5581 or apply 
in person @ 901 Sweetwater St. 
Wheeler, TX 	 1/21rtn 

Oak Firewood Deliver & Stack. 
Also Oak Trailer Flooring. Call 1- 
580/564-2797. 	12-18rtn 

(New Location, Completion 
and Plugging Report made pos-
se* by Oa Gas Repotting Ser-
ve°, 3930 BeaverSt. Vernon, TX 
76384, Doris Harrison, Phone: 
940/552-6641) 

Week Ending January 28, 2010 
Intentions to Drill 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
ALLISON-PARKS Granite Wash) 
Chesapeake Operating Inc., 
#201 H Lohberger, 250' from 
South & 1980' from West line, 
Sec. 1, —, B&B, PD 14000' (BHL: 
350' from North & 1980' from West 
Sec. line) Horizontal 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
BEGERT 10200) Laredo Petro-
leum Inc., #3 Begert Trust"6'. 
2209' from North & 590' from West 
line, Sec. 6, 41. H&TC, PD 
13500'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
BEGERT 10200) Laredo Petro-
leum Inc. #4 Elm Creek Ranch 
'6', 520' from South & 1177' from 
West line, Sec. 6, 41, H&TC, PD 
13500'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
BEGERT 10200) Laredo Petro-
leum Inc., Elm Creek Ranch 
'34', Sec. 34, A-1, H&GN, PD 
14500' for the following wells: 
#3, 879' from South & 2167' from 
West line of Sec. 
#4, 605' from South & 396' from 
East line of Sec. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
BEGERT 10200) Laredo Petro-
leum Inc., #7 Elm Creek Ranch 
'46', 1857' from South & 609' from 
West line, Sec. 46, A-1, H&GN, 
PD 13500'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & 
BEGERT 10200) Laredo Petro-
leum Inc., #7 Helton"6*, 1173' from 
South & 653' from West line. Sec. 
6. A-1, H&GN. PD 13500'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & BUF-
FALO WALLOW Granite Wash) 
Granite Operating Co., #9 Huff '9', 
2522' from South & 1980' from 
East line, Sec. 9, M-1, H&GN, PD 
13700'. 
HEMPHILL (HEMPHILL Granite 
Wash) Cimarrex Energy Co., 

It pays to Advertise 
in 

The Wheeler Times 
Phone & Fax: 826-3123 

wtImesivcentramedla.net 

ass! e 
Parkview Hospital and Assisted 
Living is now accepting applica-
tions for nurse's aides. Full time, 
part time, and PRN positions 
available. Competitive salary and 
excellent benefit package. Please 
call Sue Stiles, CNO @ 826-5581 
or apply in person @ 901 
Sweetwater St. Wheeler, Tx 

1/21rtn 

Cash—S4.00 for first 20 words 
Charge—$6.00 for first 20 words 
15c for each additional word 
Open Rate: $2.50 Per Col. In. 

Card of Thanks:$5.00 For Sale: 1994 Chevrolet Chey-
enne. Single Cab 4x4. New mo-
tor with 90,000 miles left on war-
ranty, 190,000 miles on truck. 
$3800.00 OBO. Contact Jonathan 
at 806-570-4597 or 256-5189 • 

2 Bedroom House For Sale in 
Wheeler. 602 Sweetwater. Newly 
remodeled with new cabinets. 
new floors & new bathroom fix-
tures. 580-515-2080 or 580-339- 
2698. 	 11/24rtn 

Black Bulls For Sale: Ready for 
service. Bred and raised to con-
vert grass into quality beef with-
out grain or hay. Wintered on dor-
mant native grass and protein 
cubes. These Improved Beef Ma-
chine bulls are performance 
proven and LBW. Reasonable. 
Contact Joe VanZandt — 845- 
2101 or 669-5436. 	12/24-516c 

• 
Cedar Firewood for Sale. Local 
Delivery (806) 845-1031 

Wheeler Classifieds Are Read!  
CrossworcimomzEmam 
Crossword 	 57 

5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 

anti 

IS 16 

to 

tin 
22 

25 

26 V 28 30 ■■32 33 3-1 

36 fl 36 

41 42 4"s 

nu 45 46 47 

48 49 so 51 

56 57 

SE 59 60 61 62 63 

65 i 

69 70 71 

'2 

nu 

73 74 

4 szacigni cot &sty Badye 

Receive a 
FREE hat Blasi • 

Join us for our three-day Building Value Days 
Open House February 11-13, from 8 a.m.-6 p.m. 

800-447-7436 
MORTON 

BUILDINGS' 

Court C/C PROBATE-Richard Cline to 
Ex Parte, 1-21-10. 
OL-Marvin Dale Barker to Bob J. 
Weatherly, 1-13-10. SW/4 Sec. 
26. Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 

HEIRSHIP AFF.-Peggy J. Higgins 
to Thelma C. Barnard. 11-23-09, 
Sec. 23, Camp County School 
Land. 
RMML-Guy's Plumbing Heating 
& Air Ltd. to Bill Stiles, et al, 6-
12-09, No Land Listed. 

(from Page 3) 
AMEND. UCC DT-Matt Moore to 
First National Equipment 
Financing Inc., — — 	280 acs. 
W/2 Sec. 58, 81k. A-8, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
D-Howard Lohberger Living Trust 
to William J. Ridgway, et ux, 1-
22-10, SW/4 Sec. 95 and N/2 
NW/4 Sec. 86, Blk. A-5. H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN./CONVEY.-Robert H. 
Kraus Sr., et al to Fairway 2001-
1 LLP, 11-25-09, N/2; E/2 SW/4 
Sec. 2, Blk. 27, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
ASSIGN. CONVEY. BS-Azalea 
Properties Ltd. to Modano Oil & 
Gas LP, 12-22-09, Sec. 20, Blk. 
A-3, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MEMO OL-Black Stone Natural 
Resources LLP to Sanguine Gas 
Exploration LLC, 12-30-09, NE/4 
Sec. 28, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
ASSIGN.-8 Way Oil & Gas Inc. 
to Sanguine Gas Exploration 
LLC, 12-18-09, SE/4 Sec. 22, ak. 
A-7, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MEMO. OL-ADW Petroleum LP 
to PAC Production Company, 1-
14-10, NE/4; N 200 acs. W/2 Sec. 
2. 81k. 4, Brooks & Burleson 
Survey. 
MEMO. OL-ADW Petroleum LP 
to PAC Production Company. 1-
14-10, SW/4 and NW/4 Sec. 1, 
Blk. 4, Brooks & Burleson Survey. 
MEMO. OL-West-Miller Trust to 
PAC Production Company, 12-
18-10, N 200 acs. W/2 Sec. 2. 
Blk. 4. Brooks & Burleson Survey. 
MEMO. OL-West-Miller Trust to 
PAC Production Company, 12-
18-10, NW/4 Sec. 1, Blk. 4, 
Brooks & Burleson Survey. 
LEASE-Stiles Land Assets Ltd. to 
Centerpoint Energy Field 
Services Inc., 10-29-09, 100' x 

Copy ight © 2009 PuzPuz Puzzles - www.puzpuzpuzzles.com 

54. Cliff's pal 
"Cheers" 
56. Exude 
58. Hair wash 
61. Double sawbuck 
64. Medical 
breakthrough 

12. Bad day for Caesar 
13. Ration (out) 
21. Cliffside dwelling 
23. Not square 
26. asst. 
27. Booze 
28. Pitched 

on Across 
I. Long, long time 
5. Amorphous creature 
10. Slight 
14. Extinguish 
15. Cell alternative 
16. Man Friday 
17. Assortment 
18. Popped up 
19. Convene 
20. Charge 
22. Done within a 
business 
24. Half a fortnight 

(Continued Page 6) 
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Namar e e 'Pr-  a w H&H Tire a H&H Dirt Works we. 

EQUIPMENT FOR SALE 10.1 ACRES , SOUTH Texas. Brush. heavy 
cover. Dccr. hogs. Jim Wells County, north 

NEW NORWOOD SAW MILLS- Lumber  of San Diego. $29,500. low down. low 
Mate-Pro handles logs 34" diameter. mills monthly. Toll-free 1-866-286-0199. www. 

westerntexasland.com 

403 S. Red River 
Wheeler, TX 79096 

65. Concentrated, in a 
way 
67. Hammock holder 

806/826-5159  
30. Cuban dance 
32. Gush forward 
quickly 
33. Argentine dance 
34. A deadly sin 
36. Gallery display 
38. High card 
42. Astound 
43. Lately 
46. Lacking of 
standards or prix 
49. Catch, as in a 
50. Chop (off) 
52. Thick creamy soup 
55. Blush 
57. Title holder 
58. Ponzi scheme, e.g. 
59. Waikiki wiggle 
60. Treaty subject 
62. The Magi, e.g. 
63. Calendar span 
66. Flower starter 
68. Shortly before? 

TexSCAN Week of 
January 31, 2010 

boards 27" wide. Automated quick-cycic-
sawing increases efficiency up to 40%! www. 
NorwoodSawmills.com/300N, 1-800-661-
7746 Ext 300N. 

AUCTIONS 
$106 MONTH BUYS land for RV/motor 
home/house, pier, boat ramp, pool, club-
house. gated entry, on Lake Fork, $690 down 
(56900/10.91%r7y0 Guaranteed financing. 
1-214-696-2315 

FORECLOSED HOME A L. CTION 150+ 
Homes. February 15th. OH: 2/6, 2/13 & 
2/14. View full listings at www.Auction. 
corn. REDC -RE 0580708 

25. Honouree's spot 	69. " 	for the poor" 
26. Daisy like bloom 70. Assess 
29. " 	we having fun71. Pinocchio, at times 

HEALTH 
HERNIA REPAIR? Did You receive a Composts 
Kugel Mesh Patch between 1999-2008? If the 
Kugel patch was removed due to complications of 
bowel perforation, abdominal wall tears, puncture 
of abdominal organs or intestinal fistulae. you may 
be entitled to compensation. Attorney Charles 
Johnson. 1-800-535-5727. 

Mustang Auto Care 
110 S. Alan L. Bean Blvd.—Wheeler, TX 

806.826-0948—Hrs: M-F-8-5 

PUBLIC AUCTION 450+ Travel Trailers. 
Park Homes, Mobile Homes. 2007.2005 
Models - No minimum price! Carencro. LA. 
Saturday, Feb 6. 2010. 1-225-686-2252 or 
uww.hendersonauctions.com 

676 ACRES-REEVES County, 15 Miles North 
Pecos. River frontage. Call Jack 1-214-755-6224. 

$106 MONTH BUYS land for RV, 
MH or cabin. Gated entry, $690 down. 
156900/10.91%i/7yr) 90 days same as cash. 
Guaranteed financing. 1-936-377-3235 

yet?" 	 72. Beat to a pulp 

31. Noodles 	73. Church official 
35. Showy bloom 	74. Past time 
37. It's a free country 
39. Calphalon product Down 
40. Rub out 
41. Feel concern or 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 
HELP WANTED ALL CASH VENDING! Do you earn $800 

in a day° Your own local candy route. 25 
machines and candy. All for 59.995. 1-888-
625-5481. Multi Vend, LLC. 

MEYERS CANYON RANCH #21. 206.57 
acres. Shared water well. White tail deer. 
$425/acre. Owner financed or TX Vet. I -866-
286-0190 

ABLE TO TRAVEL Hiring 8 people. No 
Experience necessary. Transportation & Lodg-
ing furnished. Paid training. Work and travel 
entire USA. Start Today' www.protekchemical. 
com. 1-410-800-3614 

1. Big fuss 
2. Apple variety 

interest 	 3. Give off, as light 
44. "Rocks" 	4. Metal workers bond 
45. It has a certain ring 5. Abreast (of) 
to it 	 6. Old Finish money 
47. Arise 	 7. "I" problem 
48. The post at the top 8. In addition 
or bottom of stairs 	9. "Gladiator" setting 
51.40 winks 	10. Indian turnover 
53. Role player 	t I . In 	of 

DRIVERS SCHOOLS/TRAINING 
ARE YOU A Company Driver? Need more 
money/better runs? Call S&H today for more 
information. I year experience. Good MVR and 
safety record required. 1-877-213-9192 

CDL DRIVERS NEEDED to deliver trucks 
and buses from TX and OK. Average run is 900 

We pay competitive rates. tolls and permits. 
Contact recruiting at 1-866-764-1601 or www. 
qualitydriveaway.com for more information and 
to submit an application. 

HOMES FOR SALE AIRLINIS ARE HIRING, Train for high 
paying aviation maintenance career. FAA 
approved program. Financial aid if qualified. 
Housing available. Call Aviation Institute of 
Maintenance. 1-888-349-5387 

ATTEND COLLEGE ONLINE from home. 
Medical. Business, Paralegal. Accounting. 
Criminal Justice. Job placement assistance. 
Computer available. Financial aid if qualified. 
Call 1-888-205-8920. ww w.CenturaOnline.com 

FORECLOSED HOME AUCTION 150+ 
Homes. February 15th. OH: 2/6, 2/13 & 
2/14. View full listings at www.Auction. 
corn. REDC -RE 0580708 

LIVESTOCK 

A to TIRE 
ANGUS BULL SALE, 2/13/2010. 1:00 pm 
Groesbeck Auction and Livestock. Selling 
75 Bulls. 35 2-year-olds, 40 Fall yearlings. 
Schachcr Auction Cur. ie c. 1-811-2190102. 
TX L - 1401H 

DRIVERS-HIRING DEDICATED drivers. 
Average 585041250 per week. Great benefits. 
Home every 1-2 weeks. 1 year tractor-trailer 
experience and HS diploma or GED required. 
Call 1-888-605-5238 or apply online at ww w.  

averittcarcers.com. Equal opportunity employer. 

HIGH SCHOOL DIPLOMA graduate in 
4 weeks' Free brochure! Call now! 1-866- 
562-3650, ex r. 55. www.southeastemHS.com "Ir 

REAL ESTATE r 	 

HOME PHONE SERVICE 
1St Month FREE 

Starting at s3.99/no 
S7 -I/mo including appropriate taxes and fees 

SO Deposit • NO  Credit Check 
NO  Contracts • Everyone Approved! 

Restrictions May Apply. 

NEW 	866.934.3448 

SPRING TRAINING for a new career in heavy 
equipment. 3 week Program. Backhocs.bulldoz-
ers. trackhoes. Local job placement assistance. 
Use Tax Refund towards career' 1-866-362-6497 

ABSOLUTELY THE. BEST VIEW Lake 
Medina/13andera 1/4 acre tract, central W/S/E. 
RV/motor home/house, OK only 5830 down 5235 
month ( 12.91%/ 1 0yr). Guaranteed financing. 
More information call 1-830-460-8354 

NEED CDL DRIVERS A or B with 2 years 
recent commercial experience to transfer motor 
homes, straight trucks, tractors and buses. 
1.800-501-3783. 

STEEL BUILDINGS • 
6.5 ACRES TOWN HOME/ retail develop-
ment land. Groves. Texas. Most engineer plans 
completed! Will divide, seller finance available 
with low down. Asking 5574K. Brokcrs wel-
come! Mike 1-713-553-1590-owner. 

BUILDING CLEARANCE! All 09s & other 
aged inventory must go. Make offer. Immedi-
ate delivery, all sizes and styles. New and 
used. Terms available MORGAN BUILD-
INGS.1 -972-271-2441 

OTR DRIVERS NEEDED Flatbed. Reefer and 
Tanker Positions. Prime Inc, is a financially stable. 
expanding and grossing carrier. 9 months + OTR 
experience. 1-800-277-0212, www.prirneinc.com 

1 	News, Views & Commentary 
KPOR-FM, 90.5 

NOTICE: While mast advertisers arc reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advtrtiscd. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt. 
contact the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP The FTC web site is www.fic.gov/bizop WHEELER, TEXAS 

Weekdays: 6:00 a.m. to 7a.m.  
Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network. 

A- A. A. S S a. a S 
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Dorcie Ann Porter Gillette, 
13 years old, is the daugh-
ter of Guy and Cathi Gillette 
of Crockett, TX. Dorcie is the 
granddaughter of Guy and 
Doris Gillette of Yonkers, 
New York and Louis and 
Barbara Stas of Wheeler, 
TX. 

For all your . . . 
Insurance Needs, See 

Eastern Panhandle 
lnsur. Agency, Inc. 
/ / 7 14'. Texas St.-Wheeler 

806/826-3573 
•Arrio *Hone •./.* *Health 

*Commercial •Roods 

HAPPY BIRTHDAY! 
Vomfty. Pi-lends tr eN-ell-thors 

ore Invited to 

cllirthcloy torty for 

$hlrLeey 4o/ly 

Sof:unity Februory 601  

3-15 

WheeLer C o. 14g,& r In/311y Cerner. 

-We, AIMS pitenS tt gi 

Questions 
and Answers 
for 'taxpayers 

More than 94 million 

taxpayers e-filed 

last year. When you 

e-file, you get: 

• Faster refunds 

a Fewer errors 

a Greater accuracy 

a Rapid confirmation of receipt 

■ File now/pay later option 

e-file is environmentally fri,. 

Ask your tax preparer today. 

Charles Kuntz, CPA 
111 W. Texas 	 315 N. Main 
Wheeler, TX 79096 	Shamrock, TX 79079 
(806) 826-5516 	(806) 256-3790 

1-800-313-5516 

Need Electricity? 
Limited Time Offer:  

$0 DEPOSIT* 
• Includes 1st 30 days electricity 
• NO Credit/ NO ID 
• Hablamos Espanol 

(P 1-866-934-3446 
• Terms & conditions apply. Plus tax & fees -Based on 1BR apt. 

PaylessPower 	For home only. 1st mo price subject to change. REP #10110 

9 st Monthl 
as low as 

L$89 

Mobeetie (from Page 2) 
the Mayfield luck. She got her 
knee back in shape and had just 
started working out with the soft-
ball team 10 days ago and she 
broke her little toe. So she is wear-
ing a boot again for a while. 
Brianna said she could use her 
boot because she wasn't going to 
ever use it again. Of course Harley 
had already been issued one of 
her own. Jeff didn't have to work 
on Friday so he took Harley out 
for a driving test on the snow. She 
got lots of practice in and learned 
how to put her vehicle in 4 wheel 
drive and manuever on the ice 
little. She would rather use the 4 
wheel drive more often. Dad's 
going to be watching for that one. 
She let her mother drive though 
when they went to the grocery 
store. 

Last Tuesday Lou Dean Douthit 
and daughter, Peggy, had a good 
day together and good visit. They 
were in Amarillo for doctor ap-
pointments. They were sure glad 
that they got all of that out of the 
way for a while, before the 
weather changed. 

Wednesday we made the 
rounds and did doctor visits in 
Wheeler. took care of some busi-
ness while we were there and 
then went on to Amarillo to meet 
Mom for dinner and exchange pic-
tures before my doctor appoint-
ments. We had an enjoyable din-
ner at Cheddar's. The Cardiology 
Center of Amarillo will be making 
the move to their new home in a 
bigger building over by Bob Mills 
'Furniture on the access road on 
1-40 west between Bell and 

Coulter. They are very anxious to 
get moved and settled in. They will 
start moving on the 24th of Feb. 
The lab girls and x-ray department 
are very excited to get into their 
beautiful new facility and are 
thankful for the extra room that it 
promises. I didn't hear any of the 
doctors complaining much either. 
Just an inconvience for a disrup-
tion in their scheduling for their 
patients. It will be a big adjustment 
for everyone. 

Several of the tired and true 
Bluegrass Association "pickers 
and grinners" were already getting 
signed in at the 5th Season's for 

atheir weekend of music. Even Tex 
and Eva Mc Knight from 
Wildarado were there on Wed. 
just in case the weathermen were 
right. Tex worked for the county 
enough years to know, sometimes 
you just have to hedge your bets. 
They sure weren't sorry that they 
had to pay a couple of extra night 
in Amarillo. It was a great week-
end for all that got to go. They 
were all quite comfortable and 
found plenty to do. The motels 
breakfast bar and the restaurant 
were quite well supplied for the 
long weekend. 

Jennifer called from South 
Carolina on Thurs. to see how 
things were going. They had 60 
degree weather there, but were 
expecting rain in a day or two. 
Jayden and Erica were mad be-
cause they couldn't get in on the 
snow ball fights. They just knew 
that they had moved too soon_ If 
that's all that it takes to keep the 
bad weather away I'll gladly make 
arrangements to get them back 
here. 

The kiddos and teachers got to 
have a couple of extra days off. I 
hope all you and yours are safe 
and sound and warm. 

Many of our area churches can-
celled their services on Sun.. Ken-
neth and Doreen Mayfield of 
Arnett,OK , their grandson, Joe 
Tolle, who returned from Iraq in 
Nov., and their daughter. Debbie 
Taylor of Shattuck had gotten 
cabin fever by Sun. afternoon and 
came over for a nice visit. They 
went home as soon as the freez-
ing fog started rolling in again. We 
have had some very beautiful win-
ter scenes right out our front door 
lately. 

Little Jason Parker was born at 
about the 32 week mark and was  

Sunday Hite Live 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
... Live from Canadian 

9:00 p rn to 10:00 p.m. 

4#6oz. He had to have some ab-
dominal surgery when he was 
only a day old. The doctors pre-
pared the family for a long stay in 
the hospital. He did very well 
through surgery and took them all 
by surprise with his recovery. He 
only had to stay in the hospital for 
2 weeks. Now no one is going to 
convince me that there isn't a God 
and that He doesn't hear us any-
way. Kari had him in for his one 
month check up and he is already 
at 6#. He already has Dad and 
Mom wrapped around his finger. 
Kari and Vincent are really enjoy-
ing him. Na Na and Pee Pa, 
Jackie and Fred Thrasher, are al-
ready counting the days of when 
they get to go back down and 
spend some time Jason. Please 

Allison 	(from Page 1) 
had. It is still keeping Opal and 
Juanita in as we aren't good on 
getting around on ice. I hear more 
is coming so may be a long win-
ter. 

Opal and Juanita were so very 
thankful and appreciated so much 
Curtis coming nearly everyday 
and helping with taking the trash 
out and bringing our mail and 
shoveling our ice and snow for us. 
Thanks Curtis!! He is such a 
helper 'ince helped him one 
day so we are thankful to him as 
well. When you are stuck in the 
house and can't get out to go any-
where, you are thankful for any-
one to come and help. 

Friday, Juanita Boydston made 
two pies, one was coconut cream 
for Curtis and Lillian and the other 
was pineapple cream for Vance 
and Carol. Curtis brought Opal 
and Juanita's mail and took their 
trash and took the pies with him. 
So Vance and Carol braved the 
ice and snow and went to their 
brother's house and visited with 
Curtis and Lillian Boydston and 
enjoyed the pies and played a 
game of Mexican Train. once 
won! 

Saturday, Curtis braved the icy 
and cold conditions again and 
brought Opal and Juanita their 
mail and shoveled the back porch 
and got ice and snow off their cel-
lar door and the top of the cellar. 
So it won't be so moist in the cel-
lar and on the beds and things. 
And Vance and Curtis both braved 
the ice and snow and cleaned the 
ice and snow from behind our car. 
Thanks so much to my brothers!!! 

Saturday afternoon, Juanita 
fried some potatoes and Curtis 
braved the ice and snow again 
and picked up some fried potatoes 
to eat at his house. 

Sunday, it was too icy and 
snowy for the Allison Pentecostal 
Church to have church. 

And on Sunday evening, Vance 
and Carol again braved the ice 
and snow and went to visit Curtis 
and Lillian and they all enjoyed a 
very delicious meal of eggs, pol-
ish sausage. fried potatoes, 
bisquits and gravy and pear pre-
serves. Afterwards of course they 
played a game of Mexican Train. 
Carol won!! 

Then they visited some and 
then enjoyed a bowl of soup and 
then played another game of 
Mexican Train and Carol won 

Court 	(from Page 4) 
OL-Mary Fay Brown to Bob J. 
Weatherly, 1-16-10, SW/4 Sec. 
16, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Linda Carroll Baker, et al to 
Bob J. Weatherly, 1-12-10, SW/4 
Sec. 16, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
OL-Linda Gale Wiley to Bob J. 
Weatherly, 1-12-10, SE/4 Sec. 
25, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Linda Gale Wiley to Bob J. 
Weatherly, 1-12-10, SW/4 Sec. 
26, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
JANUARY 25, 2010 
C/C JUDGMENT HEIRSHIP-Su-
san P. McBee (Deceased) to 
Pauline A. McBee Lowrie, et al, 
1-20-10, E/2 W/2 Sec. 8, Blk. A-
3, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
ABSTRACT of JUDG.-
Banclnsure Inc to Tonya Vineyard, 
1-19-10, No Land Listed. 
SURFACE ROW-Huff Brothers to 
MarkWest Oklahoma Gas Com-
pany LLC, 1-11-10, Pt. Sec. 2. Blk. 
5. Brooks & Burleson Survey. 
ROW-Boyd Huff to MarkWest 
Oklahoma Gas Company LLC, 1-
11-10, Pt. Sec. 5, Blk. 5, Brooks 
& Burleson Survey. 
PA-Gertie M. Mills to Sidney K. 
White. 1-11-10. 
PA-R.D. Mills Jr. to Sidney K. 
White, 1-11-10. 
PA-Douglas Matthew Mills to 
Sidney Kathleen White, et al, 2-
12-09. 
RDT-Sandra Jo Morris, et vir to 
Debra Lynn Reedy, et al, 1-4-10, 
Pt. E/2 W/2 Sec. 97, Blk. 23, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
D-Frank Berger, et ux to Alvin Tay-
lor, 1-13-10, Incomplete Land 
Description Sand Spur # 50. 
OL-Topsy B. Spellmann to 
Ouestar Exploration and Produc-
tion Company. 11-11-09, Pt. NW/ 
4 Sec. 54, Blk. A-4, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 

(Continued Next Week)  

keep Jason in your prayers. His 
pediatrician want him to see a 
pediatric cardiologist. Just to be 
sure that they are on the right 
track and making sure they aren't 
missing anything. 

Congratulations to Colton and 
Caleb Moore. They both did very 
well in the Winter X-games held 
in Aspen, CO. They have both 
rode atv's since they were very 
young. They both love a challenge 
and learned to do exhibition riding 
while every one else held their 

again!! YEA!! Way to go Carol! 
Monday morning, Curtis and 

Lillian received good news that 
their son and daughter in law, 
Steve and Nancy Vaughn were 
grandparents again. Steve and 
Nancy traveled to Tulsa, Okla-
homa to see their new grandson, 
Bryce Bohannon who weighed in 
at seven and half pounds. Bryce 
has a full head of black hair and 
looks just like his dad. His par-
ents are Mr. and Mrs. Andrew 
Bohannon of Tulsa, Oklahoma. 

Monday evening, Vance and 
Carol Boydston again braved the 
icy and snowy conditions and vis-
ited Curtis and Lillian and Lil 
served chips and dip and visited 
and yes played another game of 
Mexican Train and Curtis won!! 

Oh yes, Saturday Glenn and 
Betty Boydston and Curtis 
Boydston braved the icy roads 
and went to Wheeler, Texas for 
medications for Lillian and bought 
some groceries while there. 
Thanks Glenn and Betty for buy-
ing us groceries at that time. The 
store was out of bread tho, isn't 
that something! 

God Bless and Keep ya'll till  

breath. The Polaris company fur-
nished each of them with a new 
Polaris 600 IQ sled and spon-
sored them in the games. Neither 
one of the boys transitioned over 
until they got the new Polaris' sent 
to their TX home. They have only 
been riding them since the middle 
of Dec. You know what they were 
doing every spare minute. They 
boys ran from Jan. 28-31. The 
boys did great for their very first 
competion. They placed 5th, 6th, 
and 8th. Congratulations Colton 
and Caleb. We are proud of you 
and all your hard work is only be-
ginning to pay off. 

Please keep our friends and 
neighbors in your prayers: Don 
and Mary Edwards. Shelton May 
and family, Jason Parker and fam-
ily. Maurita Stribling, Bill and 
Shirley Dyson. Bernice Hefley. 
Louise Hogan, Joe Hathaway, 
Mellie Kelly, Wanda Herd, Mabel 
Tabor, Barbara and Dale 
Richardson, Iva Richardson, 
Ronnie Stuart, Peggy Dunn, Leola 
Stuart, Peggy Frazier, Lou Dean 
Douthit, Leola Farris, Dick and 
Ann Graham, Mary Whitener 
Cristin White, Harley Mayfield, 
Annie Ruth Lee, Marcille Payne, 
Kenny Frankenbery, Ralph 
Mayfield, Melba and Joe Darnell, 
Louise Shorter, Melba and Dale 
Corcoran. our countries leaders 
and all of the military personnel 
and their families. 

Have a great week. 
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branch office to see how things 
were on Thursday. Judge Hefley 
was in the office, but the court-
house closed early. 

— cwe —
Computers and internet are 

great and we are in trouble when 
there are problems with them. 

— cwe — 
We did not play cards on Mon-

day. as I needed to work on the 
paper. 

Solution 
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Lay's or 
Wavy Lay's' BUY ONE GET ONE 
reg. $3.99 

select varieties 

103-11 oz. FRE 

Ribeye 
Steaks 
preferred trim 
boneless beef lb. 

99 

I 

• 
Backpack- (from Page 1) 
Texas in 2008 to start the program 
in Clyde. which serves over 70 
children. As of 2009 the overall 
program serves over 550 children 
at 23 locations in west Texas. 

The school teachers identify 
children who are eating meals at 
school, but are showing signs of 
hunger and possible not eating at 
home in the evening. A notice is 
sent home to the parents for per-
mission for their child to partici-
pate, as well as to find out about 
any dietary restrictions or allergies 
and any other siblings that are liv-
ing at the home — Backpacks for 
Kids sends a sack of food home 
for each child living in the house. 

The teacheo have reported an  

increase in attendance and atten-
tiveness in the children once they 
start receiving the backpacks. 
Rachel says, This past year. 
there was a child whose teacher 
told me that he was a handful and 
that most teachers didn't know 
what to do with him... I got a phone 
call on the last day of school for 
me to come by. I went to our room 
and in walked some of our back-
pack kids with a giant thank you 
banner where they had all signed 
their names...That one little boy 
came over and just laid his head 
in my lap and didn't want to leave 
the room. This is why I love this 
program. These kids are being 
changed just by giving them a 
basic necessity — food. 

I don't want any child to go  

through what I went through, and 
I also want them to know that they 
don't have to stay in that place. I 
want these kids to know that 
someone cares that they are hun-
gry." 

To learn more about this pro-
gram, visit the Backpack for Kids 
section of the Food Bank of West 
Central Texas' website. 

This article appeared on 
Rachael Ray's website. 

Rachel Smith Laughlin grew up 
in Wheeler and graduated from 
Wheeler High School. Maybe it 
would encourage others to start a 
program similar to the one she 
has started or might give a dona-
tion. 

This was sent to the Wheeler 
Times by Beverly Smith. Rachel  

Laughlin's parents are Joe and 
Beverly Smith. She is the daugh-
ter-in-law of Roy and Marke 
Laughlin and is the granddaugh-
ter of Patsy Smith and Bob and 
Mary Cornell. 

Chat 	(from Page 1) 

We left OKC around 1:30 and 
arrived home about 4:10. The 
highways were pretty much 
cleared. The trees were heavily 
coated with ice around Elk City 
and Sayre. 

— cwe — 
More winter is prediced for 

Wednesday, through the week-
end. 

— cwe — 
I called Wheeler from the OKC 
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select varieties 
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twowitstutt 

WHEELER 
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SHAMROCK 
CHEYENNE 

SUNRAY 
CAVA D ;1 	ilk 

Plains Milk 

$2" 

• 

• 
PRICES GOOD 

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 3 THRU 
TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 9, 

Wheeler County's Exclusive source for Plains & Shurfine Products' 

Your source for the freshest * PRODUCE * MEATS * DAIRY 

300 E. Oklahoma Ave. — Wheeler. Texas 

"Su 'Ion Your Local Merchants" 806-826-5944 

• 
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Kraft Velveeta $ 99 
pre-priced $4.49 

regular or light 

32 oz. 

Cocaseola 
Products 
select varieties 

Totino's 
Crisp Crust 
Party Pizza 
select varieties 

9-10.9 oz. 
3 for 3 12 pk. cans 	Buy 3 for $12, Get $2 off 
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Ground 
Beef 

73% lean 

99 
1lb. 

• 

MPK Foods 
Guacamole 
Mix 
mild or spicy 

1 oz. 
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14.8-32.2 oz. 

Avocados 
large 

Small Pack 

$1.79 lb. 
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44 	
L
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RE 
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