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Jody Powledge To 
Compete In Houston CHAT 
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EDITOR 

By Louis C. Stas 

be furnished by Liz Stiles and Gena 
Huckert. 

The Chamber will be Wringing to a 
close an excellent year and urges the 
members to show their support with 
their attendance. You will receive 
good food, good fellowship and good 
entertainment for your $10. 

Tickets may be obtained from any of 
the Chamber directors or by contac-
ting the Chamber of Commerce office, 
behind the City Office, or P.O. Box 
221, Wheeler, Texas 79096. 

The Annual Installation Banquet for 
the Wheeler Chamber of Commerce 
'will be Monday evening, February 26. 
1989, in the Wheeler school cafeteria. 
Emcee for the 7:00 banquet will be 
Jim Wright. 

Mr. Barbecue will cater the meal. 
The tickets are on sale at a cost of 

$10 per plate. 
As has been the practice for the 

past several years, Wheeler's 
"Outstanding Citizens" will be 
recognized. Awards will be given the 
Outstanding Man, Woman, Teenager, 

Fire Departments' 

County Wide Meeting 

Jody Powledge, a 15-year-old 
Wheeler County 4-H member from 
Briscoe, will compete in the 1990 
Houston Rodeo calf scramble on Feb. 
24 in the Astrodome. 

The calf scramble is an exciting part 
of Houston rodeo action, featuring 
Rodney Crowell and Restless Heart as 
part of that matinee performance. 

Jody, the son of Leonard and Teresa 
Powledge, will compete for one of 252 
calves to be awarded at the 1990 
Show. 

Dusty Walker To 
Scramble In Houston 

AWARDED CHAMPION PRIZE: 
Neal Ray Davis of Wheeler was 
awarded a champion prize for the 
Steer he raised in his 4-H livestock 

educational project. Neal exhibited a 
Hereford at the Jr. Steer Show at the 
94th Southwestern Exposition and 
Livestock Show. 

The good news for the week is that 
Michael, the nephew, will not be 
extradited to Maryland to face kidnap 
charges. The Meriwethers were 
notified at 11:30 Monday, that the 
federal authorities did not have the 
signed papers. 

-ewe- 
The federal felony charges against 

Michael were non existant; the arrest 
warrent used by the F.B.I. sited a non 
existant Maryland law. The 
authorities did manage to file a 
misdemeanor charge which is about 
as serious as 'writing a bad check'; 
Michael would have to face these 
charges should he travel to Maryland. 

-ewe- 
A 'Letter to the Editor' was recently 

published in an Oklahoma publication 
regarding. Michael's case and shows 
an outsider's point of view. We 
reprinted this letter on page 10. 

-ewe- 
Happy Birthday to the Boy Scouts of 

America. 

Employee and Farmer and/or Ran-
cher. Added this year will be an award 
for "Outstanding Contribution to 
Agriculture". 

Officers and directors were elected 
at the February 2 meeting; installation 
will be at the banquet. David Wright, 
Johnnie Chapman, Rodney Weatherly 
and Andrea Sims were elected to 
serve on the board of directors for a 
period of three years. The group voted 
to extend the terms of the present 
president and vice president for one 
more year; Bob McCain and Ben Ed 
Hillhouse respectively fill those of-
fices. Retiring from the board will be 
Bob Frankenbery, Johnny Velasquez, 
Dan Kenney and Dickie Burton. 

Entertainment for the evening will 

Services Held For Jerilynn Gardner Wed. 

Dusty Walker, a 14-year-old 
Briscoe FFA member from Briscoe, 
will compete in the 1990 Houston 
Rodeo calf scramble on March 3 in the 
Astrodome. 

The calf scramble is an exciting part 
of Houston rodeo action, featuring 
The Highwaymen - Willie Nelson, 
Johnny Cash, Waylon Jennings and 
Kris Kristofferson as part of that 
evening performance. 

Dusty, the son of Bill and Kyla 
Walker, will compete for one of 252 
calves to be awarded at the 1990 
Show. 

WHAT: 
County-Wide Meeting of all Fire 

Departments and Governing Bodies. 
WHEN: 

February 16, 1990 
(Hamburger Feed 6:00 p.m., 

' Meeting 7:00 P.M.) 
WHERE: 

Wheeler Fire Station 
(Sixth and Sweetwater Streets) 

WHO: 
County Judge and 

Commissioners Court 
Mayor and City Council of: 

Mobeetie Shamrock 
Officers of all Wheeler County Fire 
Departments 
Members of all Wheeler County Fire 
Departments 
WHY: 
Discussion bf: Mutual Aid Operations 

Use of Equipment 
Distribution of Supplies 

Financial Liabilities 
Training Responsibilities 

HOSTED BY: 
Wheeler County and 

Wheeler Volunteer Fire Department 
Please make every effort to attend! 

Wheeler FFA Chapter 
To Conduct Pork Sale Local FFA Members 

To Exhibit At Houston 
The Wheeler FFA Chapter will be 

conducting a pork sale to help offset 
expenses on studehts projects that did 
not make the premium sale at the 
Wheeler County Livestock Show. The 
meat will be processed by Clint and 
Sons at White Deer and will be for 
sale by members of the Wheeler FFA 
Chapter. We will be offering for sale 
cured hams, Polish sausage, and 
sausage. The hams should average 
about 13# and the sausages will be in 
2# packages. To order your pork 
please contact any FFA member or 
call the Ag Department at Wheeler 
High School at 826-3735 or 826-5534. 

Jerilynn Gardner, 33, died Satur-
day, February 3, 1990 in Dallas. 

Services were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Wednesday, Feb. 7, 1990 in Wheeler 
Christian Center Church. Rev. Ricky 
Pfeil, pastor, officiated. Graveside 
services were at 3:30 p.m. Wednesday 
in Gruver Cemetery at Gruver by 
Wright Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Gardner was born in Guymon, 
OK. She graduated from Gruver High 
School. She lived in Lewisville for trhe 
past four years, moving from Califor- 

Mrs. Gardner was born in Guymon, 
Okla. She graduated from Gruver 

High School. She attended Cisco 
Junior College, Frank Phillips Junior 
College and graduated from West 
Texas State University. She lived in 
Lewisville for the past four years, 
moving from California. She was an 
insurance adjuster for a company in 
Dallas. She was a member of Cross-
road Bible Church in Lewisville. 

Survivors include a daughter, 
Bethany Gardner of the home; her 
father and stepmother, Dee and 
Agnes Miller of Wheeler; a brother, 
Denton Miller fo White Settlement; 
four sisters, Carolyn Scroggs of 
Paonia, Colo.; Lola Fannin of Bloom-
ington, Ill., Cathy Hamit of Lindsay, 
OK., and Deborah Walker of Guy-
mon, OK.; and several nieces and 
nephews. 

Pallbearers were Wayne Fannin, 
Bus Hamit, Dan Miller, Denton 
Miller, Ames Scroggs, Milton Walker. 

Twenty nine FFA members from 
Wheeler will be joining 4-H and other 
FFA members from throughout the 
state for showring competition at the 
upcoming Houston Livestock Show, 
Feb. 17 through March 4 at the 
Astrohall. 

These FFA and 4-H exhibitors 
compete in one of two divisions of the 
Houston Livestock Show - the junior 
show division. The other division, the 
open show, attracts its exhibitors from 
the world's agricultural industry, 
primarily professional breeders and 
ranchers. 

Entries in both the open and junior 
shows combine with horse show 
eptries to make the Houston Livestock 
Show the world's largest. 

Shamrock FFA: George Bruton, 
Shamrock, Market Barrows; Jered 
Chadwick, Shamrock, Market 
Barrows; Steve Hooten, Shamrock, 
Market Barrows; Lynn Mills, Sham- 

Continued Page 8 

_.../4rriver I Avant Mei 
Old Admissions 
1-17 	Virgil Helton 

Avis Stas 
1-18 	Mary Owens 
New Admissions 
1-29 	Lucy Skipper 

Nola Crisp 
1-30 	Ben Trout 
2-1 	Jim Garner 

Britton Davis 
Amy Watts 

2-2 	Tammy Slatton 
Pearl Hudson 
Margaret Francis 

2-3 	Rhonda McWhorter 
2-4 	Doris Taylor 

Weldon Simmons 

4-H Members To 
Exhibit Prize Stock 

Dismissals 
1-29 
1-30 
1-31 

2.2 

Eleven 4-H members from Wheeler 
will be joining other 4-H and FFA 
members from throughout the state 
for showring competition at the up-
coming Houston Livestock Show, Feb. 
17 through March 4 at the Astrohall. 

These 4-H and FFA exhibitors 
compete in one of two divisions of the 
Houston Livestock Show - the junior 
show division. The other division, the 
open show, attracts its exhibitors from 
the world's agricultural 	industry. 

Continued Page 8 

Anthony Rodriguez 
Annabelle Kirkpatrick 
Delphia Carpenter 
A.W. Burrell 
Myrtle Dearing 
Clara Roberts 
Elizabeth Richardson 
Theodore Heide 
Tammy Slatton 
Nola Crisp 
Rhonda McWhorter 

BRISCOE FHA 

Spaghetti Supper 

class and presented Dusty with a 
T-shirt which said, "I love to read!" 
Also present to honor Du5ty were his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Danny Wolf 
and Beth Shelton, elementary library 
aide. Mr. Helton came by to congrat-
ulate Dusty and tell him we're proud 
of his accomplishment. Congratula-
tions Dusty! 

-ewe- 
It is time to get your tickets for the 

annual Chamber of Commerce 
Banquet scheduled for Monday 
evening, February 27, at the school 
cafeteria. Check with a Chamber 
member or stop by the Chamber 
office. 

-ewe- 
Yours truly left Wednesday after-

noon, January 31, to attend the Texas 
Press 'Association Winter Convention 
in Dallas. Jim Hudson of the 
"Perryton Herald" furnished the 
transportation and did the driving. 
Sandy Wood of "The Golden Spread" 
of Follett accompanied us. 

-ewe- 
Yes, I did have one of my 'experien-

ces'. When the family travels, the 
food is usually on a bun or 'extra 
crispy' and on a cone or in a cup. In 
last week's situation, the driver 
selected the restaurant; I have never 
seen such a list of letters on a sign and 
couldn't even start to • spell it. They 
served 'cajun' food—as Vetola would 
say: 'W.O.W.' 

-ewe- 
A choice from the menu. What 

could they do to catfish if I didn't 
order it 'blackened'. After my fellow 
diners had hor derves of oysters on a 
half shell and something I had never 

in 

	

	heard of and couldn't start to spell, 
the main courses were served; my 
catfish and their blacked red fish. It 
looked good and they were quite 
generous with the portions. There was 
a question after the first bite and 
when I picked up the second bite, I 
realized what they could do to 
catfish—not cook it enough. No 
problem; send it back. The second 
plate, after a period of time during 
which the others were enjoying their 
meal, was served. Everything ap-
peared fine until I took the second 
bite; once again not completely 
cooked. Now I am selective in what I 
eat, but not necessarily picky in how it 
is cooked, but catfish should 'flake' 
not 'string'. The french fries and rolls 
were delicious. The manager came 
over, 'made it right' and gave me a 
certificate for a free meal—as if I am 
going to be back. 

-cwe- 
We heard about all the bad weather 

you were having in Wheeler as we 
were enjoying spring rains and thun-
der storms. 

HONORED: Dusty Wolf was honoreu 
by his first grade classmates for 
having read so many books to his 
parents during the month of January. 
Dusty read 83 books and received a 
scoop of ice cream for each book he 
read. Dusty's cone not only reached 
the ceiling, but it continued half of the 
way across the classroom. 

Megan Hampton represented the 

KATHRYN AMU 
VAUGHAN CHRISTNER 

Lea Christner is pleased to 
announce the arrival of her baby 
sister, Kathryn Azile Vaughan Christ-
ner. She arrived Sunday, January 28 
at 3:50 p.m. in the Ochiltree General 
Hospital, Perryton, TX. Kathryn 
weighed 8 lbs. and was 20 in. long. 
Her parents are Greg and Susan 
Christner. Grandparents are Mac and 
Mary K. Christner of Wheeler and 
Harold and Myra of Nashville, Ark. 
Great grandparents are Bud and Sally 
Brainard of Canadian and Mrs. John 
Young of Nashville, Ark. 

JORDAN CHEYANNE MOORE 
David and Monica Moore are 

proud to announce the arrival of 
Jordan Cheyanne Moore. She was 
born January 23. She weighed 7 lbs. 4 
ozs. and was 19 inches long. 

She is also welcomed by her 
grandparents, Darrell and Donna 
Moore of Wheeler, Ron Taylor of 
Briscoe, and LaDonna Henley of 
Ardmore, OK. 

Proud breat grandparents are N.L. 
"Shorty" and Sallie Sechrist of 
Wheeler, Howard and Sammie 
Caswell of Sayre, OK., Vera Barnes of 
Wheeler and Irene Lester of Wheeler. 

Two Wheeler Students 
Attend Festival 

-cwe- 
I was quite surprised to return to 

Wheeler Saturday evening and not 
find snow. 

-ewe- 	Continued Page 8 

Mitchie Loyd and Rochelle Rives 
attended the Solo and Ensemble 
Festival Saturday in Canyon. 

Mitchie Loyd received a 1st 
Division. 

Rochelle Rives received a 2nd 
Division. I WEATHER 

WHEELER TRACK TEAM 

Collecting Cans 

Local Ladies Receive 
Nursing Certificate 

The 1989-90 class of Clarendon 
College Vocational Nurses would like 
to announce their graduation cere-
mony which will be held February 16, 
1990 at 7:00 p.m. in the First Baptist 
Church. Shamrock, TX. 

All family and friends are invited to 
attend. 

Those graduating are Brenda 
Beeler, Patti Bradstreet, Debra Cook, 
Claudia Cook, Cindy Lewis, Christy 
Jones, and LeeAnn Lehman. The 
instructor is Betty Hobbs, R.N. 

F.H.A. members of Briscoe will 
be celebrating F.H.A. week Feb. 11 -
17. To kick things off they plan an all 
you can eat Spaghetti Supper Monday 
Feb. 12 from 6:30 to 8:30 in the school 
cafeteria. The prices are $3.00 for 
adults and $1.50 for 12 and under. 

F.H.A. pamphlets with the purpose 
and goods of the club will be available 
at the supper. The group also plans 
during the week to have a Mr. Legs 
Contest, a Red and White Day, and a 
Faculty Appreciation Day. 

Saturday night the group will end 
the weeks activity with an F.H.A. 
Sweetheart Banquet for members 
only. 

WHEELER METHODIST U.M.Y. ALLISON FHA TO HAVE 

Bake Sale Valentine Cakes Sale 
The Allison FHA will be baking 

Valentine cakes for sale. Large Heart 
cakes will be $12.00 and small heart 
cakes will be $8.00. Flavors available 
are chocolate, white. strawberry• 
and spice. To place your order contact 
the Allison School at 3'5-2433. 

The Wheeler U.M.Y. (United 
Methodist Youth) is having a bake 
sale on Saturday, February 10, 1990 at 
Thriftway Supermarket in Wheeler. 

Sale begins at 9:00 a.m. Come in 
and get your desserts for the week-
end. 

The Wheeler Track Team is again 
in the process of collecting aluminum 
to help defray the cost of the trip to 
San Angelo. If you have any alumi-
num cans or scrap aluminum that you 
would like to donate, it would be 
greatly appreciated. We will gladly 
pick it up if you contact a team 
members, or Coach Ronnie Karcher at 
the school, Phone 826-5534 or at home 
826-3220. 

Lo Hi Pre 
36 63 0.00 
45 53 0.00 
25 34 0.00 
27 50 0.00 
22 61 0.00 
31 59 0.00 
33 62 0.00 

1-29, 17 
1-10, 75 

1.42" 
01.42" 

.72" 

ESTABLISHED FUND: Pictured 
above are the members of Xi Upsilon 
Eta who recently collected donations 
for the popcorn machine for the Care 
Center. Pictured are: (front row) 
Cathy Hunt, Jane Thomas. Marie 

Date/Day 
01-31, Wed. 
02-01, Thurs. 
02-02, Fri. 
02.03, Sat. 
02.04, Sun. 
02-05, Mon. 
02-06. Tues. 
Low for the year: 
High for the year: 
Total moisture for month: 
Total for year: 
Total snow: 

Courtesy: KPDR-FM Radio Adams, Debbie Kinnaman. Kay 

Luttrell, Debbie Enloe, Kyla Walker, 
Sharon Frankenbery, and Marilyn 
Berry. (Back row) Jane Dukes, Brenda 
Childress and Sherry Lewallen. Not 
pictured were: Lou Trimble, Lacey 
Hathaway and Dena Brown. 

4 

p 

THE WI-FEELER TIMES 
CUSPS 681-960) 

VOLUME 56, NUMBER 11 	 THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 8, 1990 	
Single Copy: 

"Wheeler, town of friendship and pride." 
35° 

wig WORTH )1vvr- 

2-3 
2.4 



What choices will your child 
make as a teenager? 

Many parents today are expressing fear 
of the choices their children will make 
tomorrow as teenagers. This, fear is based 
on rising druguse, pregnancy, abortion, 
crime and suicide. 

The choices you're making today in 
raising your children will affect their choices 
as teenagers. As a parent you can learn the 
skills necessary to instill your child with 
courage, responsibility and cooperation ... 
qualities that will equip them to make the 
right choices. 

Active Parenting is a highly successful 
program designed to provide parents with 
sufficient information, skills and support to 
handle the challenges of parenting in the 
80's. Using video — today's most dynamic 
medium — Active Parenting shows typical 
family conflicts and their simple, effective 
resolutions. Further parenting information 
comes from an informative Parent's Hand  
book and an Action Guide. As a group — 

composed of a leader and other parents 
struggling with similar concerns — you will 
engage in stimulating discussions and 
activities. 

Parents across the country are finding 
Active Parenting to be both educational and 
entertaining. And most importantly, they're 
finding that their children are responding to 
the Active Parenting approach. To learn 
more about the Active Parenting program 
and how to positively influence the choices 
your child will make contact: 

First 
United 

Methodist 
Church 

826-3114 

Active 
At A p parenting 

MAXEY'S 
STEAKHOUSE 

SUNDAY BUFFET 
Salad Bar 

Roast Beef Au has 
Fried Chicken 

w/Cream Gravy 
Whipped Potatoes 

Whole Kernel Corn 
Peas & Carrots 

Iced Tea/Coffee 
Dessert 

Thursday Nights 
• • • 

All the Fresh Water 

Catfish & Shrimp 

you can eat. 
Served with onion rings. 

French fries, hush puppies 
and cole slaw. 

Sun.—Noon Buffet (Only) 11:30-1:30 

• Closed Monday • 

Phone: 826-3441 
1 Mile South of Wheeler on U.S. 83 
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Jerry Watts, Ora Underwood and Jim 
Montgomery all of Wheeler, Emma 
Lea London, Gloom, R.W. and 
Dorthea Beck and Mary Kramer all of 
Lefors, Glynnda and Butch Leather-
man and Chris of Perryton. Leona 
House, Wilhelmina Sherrell, Melba 
and Dale Corcoran, Clinton and 
Maurita Stribling, Susie, Katie Jo and 
Zachery Mabry, Austin Caldwell, 
Maggie Myers and Ada Lou Lester all 
of Mobeetie. 

Visiting Sat. with Wilber Beck was 
Glynnda Leatherman of Perryton, 
Edna Bryant of Amarillo, Billie Cary 
of Jacksonville, Michelle Ward of 
Mesquite, Cecile Burke of Grand 
Prairie. 

Glynnda Leatherman of Perryton 
spent Sat• night with Edith McLaugh-
lin. 

Cecile Burke of Grand Prairie spent 
Sat. night with her uncle C.W. Burch. 

Melissa Hampton, Dusty and 
Heather of Wheeler visited her 
grandparents Ransom and Eunice 
Carter. 

Pierce and Nettie Walker visited 
Friday night with Ransom and Eunice 
Carter. 

Those enjoying Supper Sun. night 
at the City Hall was Don and Edna 
Bryant, Bobby and Tammy Nokes, 
Dawn, Maria and Thomas all of 
Amarillo, Jerrie Bennett of Claren-
don, Billie Cary of Jacksonville, Cecile 
Burke of Grand Prairie, Michelle 
Ward of Mesquite, Louie and 
Ruth Keith, Allen and Shannon 
Leatherman, Floyd Sackett, Jan 
Richie, Amy, Jeffery and Matthew 
Trusty all of Pampa. Glynnda and 
Butch Leather&an and Chris of Perry-
ton, William and Chris Burch of 
Wheeler, Wilber Beck and C.W. 
Burch of Mobeetie, R.W. and Doreta 
Beck of Lefors. 

Bernice Hefley took Eunice Carter 
to Pampa Thurs. She had hurt her 
arm. 

Denise Snuggs and Cassidy and 
Charlotte Coward went to Borger Sun. 
to pick up Casey who spent the 
weekend with his father Mark Britten. 

Gene Coward of Canadian visited 
Mon. afternoon with his mother 
Charlotte Coward. 

Charlotte Coward and Denise 
Snuggs and Cassidy went to Shamrock 
Mon. morning. 	• 

Bulah Grimes visited Bessie Galmor 
Mon. night. 

Doyle Grimes, Bob Galmor and 
Albert Trout visited the Wheeler 
Masonic Lodge Monday night. 

Those from Mobeetie attending 
services near Sayre, OK. for Thurson 
Young was Bill and Kay Caswell, 
Doyle and Bulah Grimes and Melvin 
May. Mr. Young was an uncle of Bill 
Caswell and a cousin of Doyle Grimes. 

Those visiting with Albert and Ella 
Trout was Lonnie Trout, Mindy and 
Tracy, Judy and Richie Watts and 
Camron of Hammon, K.W. and 
Dorthea Beck of Lefors. 

R.W. and Dorothea Beck of Lefors 
visited Sun. afternoon with Walter 
and Mary Ruth Morris and Gary. 

Jimmy and Laura Fern Selby and 
Michella spent the weekend in Ama-
rillo. Jimmy was doing the clinical 
part of his E.M.T. Services, Laura 
Fern and Michella visited her brothers 
Butch and Mary Wells and Wilber and 
Kay Wells. They had a wedding 
anniversary party for Wilber and Kay. 

Helen and Charles Mixon of 
Amherst has been visiting her mother 
Margaret Trout who is ill. 

Those visiting Sunday with Claudia 
Quarles was Paula and Wayne Shan-
han of Harman, OK, Roy Pat and 
Shonda Rucker, Cassie Hamilton, 
Kevin and Donna Crawford, and 
Courtney of Pampa, Don and Mary 
Margaret Quarles and Kelley. 

Calvin and Leola Stuart visited 
Bulah Stuart of the Kelton Community 
Mon. They took her to Shamrock for 
lunch and tended to business and 
visited Leola's cousin Venita Weiss 
also visiting was her aunt Vitula Davis 
of Amarillo. 

Calvin and Leola Stuart visited Sat. 
in Erick, OK. with her brother Dean 
and Ivy Richardson. Also visiting 
there was Glady Richardson of Erick 
and Eddie and Amy Richardson, 
Venissa and Jennifer of Wheeler. 

MOBEETIE LODGE #972 
The Mobeetie Lodge #972 met 

Tues. Jan. 30, 1990 to put the 3rd 
degree on Dennis Hilburn. Guests 
were Roy Henry, District Grand 
Deputy, Art Taylor, Dennis Thomas 
and Marvin Petty all of Shamrock, 
B.B. Bearden and Howard Price of 
Pampa and members Bob Galmor, 
Doyle Grimes, Rev. Ralph Hovey, 
Albert Trout and Randy McCurley. 

RETIREMENT REC. FOR 
WILBER BECK 

The retirement reception,  for 
Wilber Beck was held Sun. 2 to 4 at 
the Mobeetie City Hall. With the City 
Council and spouses, ,Mayor and new 
City Secretary hosting the event. She 
was presented a clock plaque from the 

city. Those attending were Edna and 
Don Bryant, Bobby and Tammy 
Nokes, Dawn, Maria and Thomas, 
Mary French, Amarillo, Jerrie Ben-
nett, Clarendon, Billie COry, Jackson-
ville, TX., Cecile Burke, Grand Prairie 
Michelle Ward of Mesquite, Virginia 
and George Flaherty, Louie and Ruth 
Keith, Jan, Richie, Amy, Jeffery, and 
Matthew Trusty, Allen and Shannon 
Leatherman, Floyd Sackett all of 
Pampa, Laura Eubanks, Sallie Harris, 

has been here. 
Ann Ellison dropped in to serve 

everyone a nice hot box of popcorn. 
We all have to have our weekly 
popcorn fix. Thank you Ann. 

Thank you to Glen Arganbright and 
After Hours Video for letting us show 
one of his movies Thursday afternoon. 
We chose the. "Whales of August" it 
was good, but next time lets go for a 
little more spice. We need some fast 
action! Pick us a good one Glen. 
Thank you for letting us enjoy the 
movie. 

Icyle Littrell had a visitor a few days 
ago. Kelly Abernathy dropped in from 
California. She said it was sure a 
surprise. 

Jim and Laura Davis came to see us 
after a two-week absence. We were 
very glad to have them return. It sure 
isn't the same on Fridays without 
them. 

Fannie Mae Bradstreet and Ruth 
Taylor came Friday afternoon to visit 
and serve juice so glad to see them 
again. 

Jim and Melba Montgomery came 
Sunday morning to' teach Sunday 
School. Thank you both so much. 

Thank you also to Robert Helsley 
and members of the First Baptist 
Church of Wheeler for coming in the 
afternoon for worship. 

See Ya Next Week, 
Lois 

Care Center 
By Lois 

Comsnento 
It is certainly very nice to have all 

our volunteers back once again. We 
sure missed everyone during our 
seige of the flu. 

Monday afternoon Elva Wood and 
Helen Sabbe came out to serve juice 
and visit a little with everyone. Thank 
you both very much. 

Thank you to David Wright for the 
clothing donation. 

Our month ended with a bang. We 
were thrilled to have Joe Flowers and 
the Erick Kitchen Band spend the 
afternoon with us. The whole month 
was so quiet and we were ready for 
some excitement. They have several 
in the group and we appreciate 
everyone of them. The tentitive date 
for their next visit will be (4th Thurs.) 
February 22nd. We can't wait. 

Janice Sparlin and Jo Hunt from the 
First Baptist Church came to teach 
their Wednesday morning Bible 
study. We like their visits, we all take 
part. Glad to have you back. 

Our bingo volunteers returned last 
Wednesday. They were Doraeen 
Owen, Doodie Phillips, Opal Hefley, 
and Ila Byers. We had such a big 
crowd for bingo, it was lots of fun. 
Thank you. We appreciate you all. 
Thursday morning Fern Young, 
Rozena Zybach and Sylvia Brown, 
returned for their weekly visit. We 
enjoyed it very much. It seems like 
forever since some of my volunteers (Valu•Rite)  9  Valentines Day. 

S tik•DE 
HYLAND'S 

Phone: 
826-5561 HOUSE 

PAINTING 

AND LIGHT 

CARPENTRY, ROOFING, 

PLUMBING, AND ELECTRICAL. PHARMACY 110  W. 
Texas 

Wheeler, T. 
[-1 	SPRAYED r - 

ON 
ACOUSTICAL 

A LARGE SELECTION 
INVITATION: Kansas Whiteley, born 
February 14, 1900, will be the guest of 
honor at a covered dish "Birthday 
Dinner" Sunday, February H, 1990. 
The location will be at Pam Apt. 
dining room, 1200 N. Wells in Pampa 
from 11:30 A.M. to 4:30 P.M. 
Neighbors, friends and relatives are 
invited to attend. The hosts and 
hostesses will be Vivian Riley. Betty 
Fillingim, Sidney Jackson, Donal 
Whiteley, 9 grandchildren, 17 great 
grandchildren and 4 great great 
grandchildren. 

o &oyez CEILINGS 
TYPE Li  

DONALD FORD CLEO® 
32 COUNT 
VALENTINE 
CARDS 
Choose from a variety 
of your favorite cnaracters, 

YOUR 
CHOICE 

#5 

tiqtticsHetku #40 

"I LOVE YOU" 
COUPONS 
For that special 
person in your 
life. Each coupon 
grants a wish. 

CUT, COLOR & CREATE 
ACTIVITY BOOKS 
• Great fun for the kids. 
• Develop their 

imagination and 
creativity. 

49 #I29 99 
YOUR 

CHOICE 

Scotchgard 140Z. 
FABRIC PROTECTOR a (18 

97 • Repels 
upholstery and 
household fabrics 

• Perfect for outdoor 
clothing tool EACH 

TAKES ALL 
THE GUESS 

WORK OUT OF 
WHAT FILM 

TO BUY I 
35 	

24 ing5,,,,,, 

co,  Pr wvi 	 OX LIFESAVERS 
VALENTINE 
CARDS 'N CANDY 
Contains 20 cards and 20 miniature 
rolls of life savers. 

4 

Mobeetie 
News 

‘14 lba Corcoran 

Gene and Sue Harrison enjoyed 
dinner and a movie at Pampa Monday 
night. 

Those enjoying the day Wed. at 
Verna Corcoran's were Agnes Barnes 
of White Deer, Francis Graves of 
Pampa, Pauline Barnes of Wheeler 
and Melba Corcoran of Mobeetie. 
They were having a birthday party for 
Agnes Barnes. 

Leon and Rose Mary Dockins went 
- to Amarillo Wed. night. Leon had 

cataract surgery Thurs. morning at St. 
Anthony's Hospital. They returned 
home Friday. 

Pauline Barnes took her mother 
Verna Corcoran to Pampa Thurs. for 
her blood work at Dr. Kamani and 
they visited Bessie Keaton. 

Our sympathy goes out to Audrey 
Seitz and family on the death of her 
father Aubrey B. Pond of Canyon. 

Our sympathy goes out to Pierce 
Walker and family on the death of his 
nephew Clyde Pugh who died Jan. 25 
in Calif. His funeral was Jan. 29, in 
Calif. He was a former Mobeetie 
resident. 

LaVeme Scribner entered Coronado 
Community Hospital Sat. She had a 
heart attack Mon. and went to the 
doctor for 3 days. They put her in to 
regulate her medication and treat-
ment. They didn't wnat to put her in 
because of so much flu in the hospital 
but finally decided they should. 

Visiting Sat. with Jud and Lorene 
Rector was Delbert and Coleen 
Rector, T.C. and Mindy of Amarillo, 
Bradley Stone of Pampa and Melba 
Corcoran. 
• Kay and Don Humphreys of 
Wheeler visited her brother Leon and 
Rosa Mary Dockins Sun. morning. 

Paulette Thompson and family of 
Canadian attended the homecoming 
Friday night and visited her parents 
Bill and Lena James. 

Visiting. Sun. with Bill and Lena 
James was Billy Jack and Starla 
Jackson, Donyell and Little Billy of 
Broomfield, Colo., Don Bendle of 
Okla. City Ok.. Paulette Thompson, 
Randy and Dustin of Canadian, Mark 
and Mary Thompson, Brandy, Chad 
and Jarrod, Billy and Kathy James. 
Jamie and Cody, Shannon and 
Michelle James, Ronnie, Jeannie and 
Dakota, Sonda Bendle all of Mobeetie. 

Visiting last Sunday with Pierce and 
Nettie Walker was friends Lee and 
Shirley Jackson of Pampa. 

Lynn and Jeff Corcoran of Wheeler 
visited Friday with George and Diane 
Reeves and family. 

Pierce and Nettie Walker visited 
with Ramson and Eunice Carter Tues. 
night. 

Bud and Carol Ann Scribner of 
Olton visited his mother Mrs. LaVerne 
Scribner on Wed. 

Pierce and Nettie Walker visited 
Wed. in Pampa with Opal Henderson. 

It is good to see Noami Allen out of 
the hospital and able to be out with 
her daughter Lou. 

Emma Lea London of Groom visited 
Sun. with Maggie Myers. 

Our sympathy goes out to Foy 
Farmer on the death of his brother-in-
law, Foy M. Satterfield of Pampa. He 
passed away Sat. in Pampa. 

Visiting over the weekend with 
James and Alisha Moffett and John 
was James' sister Ona Mae Brogden 
of Clarendon and neices Cindy Pollard 
and Michella of Sunray and their 
danehter Diane Moffett of Amarillo. 

117 W. Texas St.—Wheeler, Tex. 
806/826-3573 

*Auto *Home *Life *Health 
*Commercial 	* Bonds 

MP% 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Wesley Buice 

express our sincere gratitude to one 
and all who share with us in the loss of 
Wesley. 

A very special tribute to Dwight 
Tipps and Dick DeArment who was by 
his side and administered immediate 
help for him. Our special thanks to the 
entire ambulance crew, the hospital 
staff, and Dr. Mendiola for doing 
everything possible for Wesley. 

The love and support of Weldon 
Rives, his prayers with us, and dear 
friends who came to the hospital to be 
with us meant so very much. 

The food sent to our home and to 
the church, the flowers, memorials 
and cards is deeply appreciated. May 
God richly bless each and every one. 

Lula Buice 
Kern & Janis Buice, Daniel & John 

Kenneth & Glenda, Lee, 
Lindsey & Layne 

Terry & Sherry, Shelly & 'Casey 
Elaine & Bob, Teresa, Randy & Angie 

Brenda & Danny, Heath, 
Hillary & Hadley 

Ii 

1 LB. RUFFLES 
AND LACE 
HEART BOX 
CHOCOLATES 

4" ITTY BITTY 
VALENTINE 
PLUSH 
Small plush that can 
be given as a 
gift or used 
as package 
decoration. 

99 
YOUR 

CHOICE #26 

tifF.SAVEks VALENTINE 0 

Cards 
Candy 

Polaroid 
Oflq 

Ellin  351,1111  

Polaroid 
ONE FILM 
35mm 24 SHOT 

Polaroid 

the choice el easy 

• • 

FCebtleAMMCICOM 

a 
&M 6-PACK 

VALENTINE 
CANDY 
Plain or peanut 

••••••••••••••••••' 

•

i 	

• 28 

ti; lliar 1.11 	 EACH 	----**-17- 
	ANS 	 

59 
6-PACK 

6-3106 

TRAVIS RILEY MAY, age 7 yrs. 
and CLAYTON RAMSEY MAY age 
3 yrs. are the sons of Gary and 
Carolyn May of Mobeetie. Grand-
parents are Melvin and Helen May, 
Mobeetie and Wesley and Clethel 
Steen, Wheeler. Great grandpar-
ents are Iona May, Edward and 
Lillian Bush, and Rosie Trasazel. 

For all your . . . 
Insurance Needs, See 

The McCasland-Smith 
Agency 



1st Escort Winner 

Tamra Bussey, Muleshoe. Texas 
2nd Escort Winner-

Fran Allen, Wheeler, Texas 

leferzealy id Zatieutat 7/teat Naga 

SLAB 
BACON 

1/2 Gal. 
Rds. $199  

12 oz. Cans 

401, 

Champ  
• _416.,_  

BATHROOM TISSUE 

CHARMIN 
4 ROLL PKG. 

89' 
FIRST 441 ROU. PKGS. WPTHEREAFTER '1.09 

Hormel 
Chill 

k  Bean 
nio 

o 

HORMEL PLAIN NO BEANS 

CHILI 
19 OZ. CAN 884 

bld6"11'''S 

ALL GRINDS COFFEE 

FOLGERS 
13 OZ. CAN 

GOLD MEDAL 

FLOUR 
5 LB. BAG 

891  

Idivr 

DUNCAN HINES ASSTD. LAYER 

CAKE 11°111X 

DUNCAN HINES 
ASSORTED RTS 

FROSTING 
16 OZ. CAN 

$119 

169 
FIRST 4-13 OZ. CANS 1.69THEREAFFER '1.99 

1 — 

TIE BEST MEAT IN TOWN 

1 1/2 lb. Pkg. 

FRESH FRYER 

LEG 
QUARTERS 
APPROX. 10 LB. FAMILY PAK 

LB. 

KA 

".• 

t.$1.1P4e 

RUFFLES 

POTATO CHIPS 
All Types 

$289  Size Bag $1 99 

BORDEN'S 

ICE CREAM 	PEPSI COLA 
ALL TYPES 

2 liter Btl. 99 
FROZEN 

CITRUS HILL 

ORANGE JUICE 
Select or Plus Calcium 

9' 
SHEDDRig IC3RiciAD 

3 Lb. Tubs $ 
59  

BANANAS t. 
4 lbs * P  I 

CRISCO OIL 
Reg. or Corn 

$1 49 
48 oz. Btl. 

RUSSET 

POTATOES $1 29 

10 lb. Bag 	I 

TYLENOL 
Gel-Caps $3  

69 
50 Ct. 

LIQUID 

PALMOLIVE 
DISH DETERGENT 

40c off Label 99 
22 oz. Btl. 

AJAX DETERGENT 

112. oz. $399 
Box 

 

W.I.C. and Food Stamp Customers PRICES EFFECTIVE 
Double Coupons Tues., Thurs., & Sat. FEB. 1-FEB. 3, 1990 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES. 



the smith agency 
RUTH SMITH, Broker 	GREG SMITH, Salesman 
JOE LEE, Salesman-375.2380 
BETTY LEE, Salesman- 375.2380 
JIM HILL, Salesman-826-3094 
LONA WILLIAMS, Solesman-826-3341 

Phone: 806/826-5541 or 826-3238 
LAVON WILLIAMS, Salesman & Appraiser-826-5803 

• 

\--e"nr°411B0°‘  ewe' 

r\A -;  
tie> 

,-wtatires. 

P.O. Box 1080 
Phone: 826-3123 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 790%, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
Wheeler County... $13.50 Outside County. 	515.00 

Wheeler Lodge No. 1099 

A.F. & A.M. 

MONDAY 
7:30 P.M. 

J. M Montgomery. Sec' y. 
Box 675 

Members Urged To Attend 

Visitors Welcome 

1 

For RESULTS... eall 

the smith agency 
Brick home, fully carpeted. Formal living room, large den with 

fireplace. 3 large bedrooms, 2 baths. Extra large attached double 
car garage 30x39. Fenced back yard, water well and fruit trees. 

Allison . . 

Easy to buy . . . 3 BR, 1 bath house with fireplace 
in good location. RESIDENTIAL Wheeler . . . 

Three bedroom, two bath stucco 
home on Mobeetie Street. Has 
carport and cellar. 	 #59 

• * * * 

Four bedroom mobile home on 
2+ acres nine miles east of 
Wheeler. 	 #57 

Lots of square feet for the 
money! Formerly, the Methodist 
Church, this home has unlimited 

Three bedroom, one bath home 
with spectacular fireplace. large 
lot, custom cabinets and detached 
garage on Sweetwater Street. 
Priced to sell! 	 #69 

* 5 • * #63 

This house has a new roof! One 
or two bedroom, one bath stucco 
home close to school. Also has 
apartment, garage, cellar, fenced 
yard and carport. Reduced to 
$15,000.00 WILL TRADE. 	#55 

▪ * * * 

Two bedroom, one bath home 
with carport and cellar. Garage has 
been enclosed and would make a 
third bedroom. Reduced. Will sell 
adjacent lot, also. Main Street. 56 

is • * 5 

Need room to entertain a large 
family? Three bedroom, two bath 
home with garage on large lot. 
Reynolds Street. 	 #58 

• 5 • * 

possibilities. 

ACREAGE . . . 
One-half section grassland west 

of Mobeetie. 	 #60 
• * • * 

Two bedroom, one bath home 
with barns and corrals on 6+ acres 
at southeast edge of Wheeler. #53 

* * * • 

80 acres grassland with old rock 
house north of Kellerville. 	#61 

* 5 * 5 

* 5 * « 

Office building on Main Street. 
Has been renovated. 	#64 

* 5 * * 

On Alan Bean Blvd. close to 
bank. Two bedroom, one bath 
frame home. 	 #50 

* * * • 

Invest in a retreat 45 minutes 
from Wheeler. Plenty of recreation 
for all the family. Bank says, 
"Mahe offer!" 	 #51 

• * * • 

602 Cheyenne Street. Older two 
bedroom, one bath home on lot 
with trees. 	 #52 

Shamrock . . 

5 * « * 

Owner financing on this two 
bedroom, one bath home with 
apartment on Alan Bean Blvd. #66 

* « * 5 

Three bedroom, two bath stucco 
home on corner lot 	in good 
location. Also has finished 
basement, 2 car garage and large 
fenced back yard with trees. 	#72 

* sit • * 

Three bedroom, two bath brick 
home on Bryan Street. Has 
fireplace, den and garage ready to 
add more living space. Good floor-
plan and colors. REDUCED! #68 

* * * * Assume the FmHA loan on this 
two bedroom, one bath home with 
large living area and garage in 
quiet neighborhood close to 
school. 	 #62 

5 * * * 

Cheaper house payments. Let the 
apartments pay half of your house 
payment. Beautifully decorated 
home in good location. 

Three bedroom, two bath home 
with detached garage, located on 
corner lot at the north end of 
Canadian Street. 	 #54 * * * 

40 acres grassland south of 
Wheeler. 	 #71 

* t * * • * * • * * 	* 

PRICE HAD BEEN REDUCED! 
Cheaper House Payments. Let the payment. Beautifully decorated 
apartments pay half of your house home in good location. 

1)1 
1 W. Texas After Hours Video 1 1 1 

Wheeler 
Hours;  Mon. • Sat.: I p.m. - 9 p.m. 

Sun.; 1 p.m. - 5 p.m. 	 Phone: 826-3612  

THE WHEELER TIMES 
Page 4-Thursday, February 8, 1990 Want Ads 

$60.00 PER HUNDRED 
remailing letters from 
home! Details, send self-
addressed, stamped 
envelope. Associates, Box 
309-T, Colonia, NJ 07067. FOR LEASE: 174 acres 

grassland west side of FM at 
Kellerville. phone 826-3415. 

Adams Rentals 

1. Another Chance 
2. Indiana Jones Last Crusade 
3. Pink Cadillac 
4. Night Visitor 
5. Buying Time 

More Movies due in Thursday 
Over 70 Nintendo Tapes for Rent 

/6  
n  ap- (J. 400 S. Main 

Wheeler, TX. 79096 
FINAL CLEARANCE 

SALE 
on au tabrics, jewelry, 
bubble pants and tops. 

Reduced Below Price 
Selling selected groups 

of Video Movies at $19.95 

826-3268 

STANLEY HOME PRO-
DUCTS Representative is 
Eupha Mae Sorenson, 826, 
3605, mail box by door, 
please leave a note. Try to 
see you soon. Appreciate 
your visit or business, 601 S. 
Osage. 

triaSi  We Appreciate Your Business! 
Now Your Hometown WATKINS Dealer 

Shamrock Laundry' 
Open 24 Hrs. 

7 Days a Week 
Corner of 'em & Madden St 

Shamrock, TX I will not be responsible for 
any debts other than my 
own, Paul Shumate. FOR SALE. Small piano. 

Good condition, 826-3043, 
$350.00 .  

Ta MEMBER 1990 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

IN THE DISTRICT COURT 
OF WASHITA COUNTY 

STATE OF OKLAHOMA 
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF 
CHARLES BUEL LASLEY, 

DECEASED. 
Notice Of Hearing Return of 
Sale 

NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN, that Larry W. 
Lanier, Personal Represen-
tative of the Estate of 
Charles Buel Lasley, 
Deceased (hereinafter called 
"Personal Represent-
tative"), has made a return 
of this Court of, and presen-
ted for confirmation, the 
sale made by the Personal 
Representative under the 
power of sale granted in the 
Last Will and Testament of 
Charles Buel Lasley, 
Deceased (hereinafter called 
"Decedent"), of all interest 
of the Decedent in the real 
property described on 
Exhibit "A", which is at-
tached hereto by specific 
reference and made a part 
hereof. 

The Return of Sale on file 
herein shows that such real 
property is being sold to 
Buel Lasley Farms, Inc., for 
a total consideration of 
$1,242,461.37 to be paid by 
releasing and satisfying the 
claim of Buel Lasley Farms, 
Inc. That the 16th day of 
February, 1990, at 10:00 
o'clock A.M., in the County 
Courthouse in Cordell, 
Washita County, Oklahoma 
has been appointed by the 
Court for hearing the Retur-
n, at which time any person 
interested in the estate may 
appear and file exceptions in 
writing to the Return and 
contest the same. Reference 
is hereby made to the 
Return and contest the 
same. Reference is hereby 
made to the Return for fur-
ther particulars. 

IN 	TESTIMONY 
WHEREOF. I have hereun-
to set my hand this 24th day 
of knuary. 1990.  
Signed: Ralph W. Emerson 

Judge of the District 
Court 

Johnny G. Reed 
Sally Ketchum Edwards, 

OBA No. 9419 
PHILLIPS McFALL 

McCAFFREY McVAY 
SHEETS & LOVELACE, 
P.C. 
1001 Northwest 63rd, 

Suite 205 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 

73116 
14051 848-1684 

Attorneys For Personal 
Representative 

EXHIBIT "A" 
60 Mineral acres located 

in NE/4 Section 28. T 8N R 
20W. I.M., Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY  
Real Estate 

Appraisal & Sales 
Lavon Williams 

The Smith Agency 
.2826-Ss41 	826-5803 

W YOU BUY HLALTH 
INSURANCE, you could be 
paying too much. Special-
izing in Major Medical and 
Medi-Care Supplements. 
Contact: 	Kenneth 
McCasland 826-3573 or 
826-3036. 

WANTED: A retired couple, 
at the Old Mobeetie Jail 
Museum to keep it open 
10:00 to 5:00 weekdays 1:00 
to 5:00 Sunday and closed 
Wed. To keep the grounds 
mowed and museum clean. 
Living quarters furnished. 
Utilities paid except tele-
phone. No salary paid. For 
information call 845-2251 or 
845-3311. 

Call or See JIMMY ADAMS. Wheeler 
After 6:00 P.M. 

• NEW LISTINGS • 
1-Nice 3 bedroom house (Now available) 

Located on Sweetwater St 
3 Bedroom house 
1-2 Bedroom house 

1-4 bedroom house (in country' 
1-2 bedroom brick apartment 
(water and gas paid, built-ins' 

L_DEPOSIT REQUIRED ON ALL RENTALS 

111 W. Texas TOP 0' TEXAS 

FENCING 
6' T-Post 	$1.95 each 
2 pt. Barbwire $26.50 p/r 
Cattle Panels $11.00 each 
Call after 6:00 p.m. or 

Before 7:30 a.m. 

826-3247 or 

826-5626 

I 

NEW L1bTING: Extremely 
attractive 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
brick home with fireplace 
and jumbo garage very 
comfortable living at the 
edge of Allison. Reasonably 
priced. Cornett Realty 
(Canadian) 323-8206--office 
or 323-8203-Home. 

Phone: 826-3794 

Glen s 
Barber Shop 
Licensed Barber 
Glenn Arganbright 
Gary Clemens 

Open 8:30 a.m. to 5:30 a.m. 
Monday-Friday 

Saturday by Appointment 

PRIVATE TREATY SALE: 2 
Saler Bulls, 1 black and 1 
red, 4 Saler Heifers, 2 black, 
2 red, animals are from 18 to 
20 mos. old. Lineage infor-
mation available upon 
request. Bids accepted thru 
Feb. 23, 1990. Contact First 
State Bank, P.O. Box 8, 
Mobeetie, Texas 79061. 
Phone 806-845-2311. 

CRUISE LINE HIRING! 
Immediate Openings. 
Excellent Pay. World travel! 
Call (1) 518-459-3535 Ext 
P8034B. 

RICHARD'S 
UPHOLSTERY & 

CARPET CLEANING 
Furniture-etc. 

Call: Richard Laverty 
Mobectie, texas 

Calderon Construction 
Carpentry, Concrete, Masonery, 
Stucco, Roofing, Painting, Drywall 

FREE ESTIMATES 
All Work Guaranteed 

19 Years Experience 
References Upon Request 

Call 826-3639 after 5:30 P.M. 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
home, with 4 to 9 acres, 
west edge of Wheeler, 
James Verden, 826-5965. 

PUPPIES TO GIVE AWAY, 
826-5976. 

FARM.  
'BUREAU 

TEXAS 

WANTED TO BUY 
300 to 400 weight calves 

and 700 weight calves 
Please Call: 

806/358-8826 or 
after 7:00 p.m. 

Call 806/353-3925 

AA MEETING 
Alcoholics Anoymous 

meets at.8:00 p.m.?in the 

Commissioners Court 
Room of Wheeler Co. 
Courthouse on Thursday 
of each week. 

GOVERNMENT SEIZED 
vehicles from $100. Cor-
vettes, Chevys, Porsches, 
and other confiscated pro-
perties. For Buyers Guide 
1(800) 448-2562 ext 5378. 
Also open evenings and 
weekends. 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING 
1/2  Beef, Beef cuts and Pork. 
Shamrock Slaughter Plant. 
We accept food stamps. 
256-3241. Hours: Mon. - Fri. 
8-12 1-5, Sat. Closed. 

TEXAS 
FARM BUREAU 
Insurance Companies 

Gary Alston 
Agency Manager 

Gary Ware 
Agent 

Phone:806/826-3563 

NE/4 Section 25, T 11N R 
14W, I.M., Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

FOR SALE: 1982 Silverado 
10 pickup. runs good with 
topper, 826-3466 or come by 
1107 Alan Bean. Wheeler, 
cash only. 

It 

FOR SALE OR RENT: 1982 
Windsor Mobile Home, 
14'x80', 110'xIll' lot, 
Kitchen appliances, 2 bed-
room, 2 baths in Wheeler. 
Call Mike at 375-2.321. 

FOR SALE: 54 cows, calving 
now thru April 15. 28 head 
mixed at 5625. 26 head 
choice blacks at $765. 
806/826-5735. 

Block 6, Town of Colony and 
the S/2 of Lot 4, Lots 5 to 26 
and the S/2 of Lot 27, Block 
7, Town of Colony, Section 
10. T 10N, R 14W, 1.M., 
Washita County, Oklahoma 

75 Mineral acres located 
in N/2 less and except 10 
acres in the SE/4 NE/4 
NE/4 and the W/2 E/2 
SE/4 and the W/2 SE/4 
Section 4, T ION, R 14W 
I.M., Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

FOR SALE: One registered 
Polled Hereford Bull, 3 yr. 
old, 826-5774. 

160 acres minerals located 
in Lot 1 and 2, S/2 NE/4 
Section 5, T ION, R 13W, 
1. M . 	Caddo 	County, 
Oklahoma 

C.K. HUNTING SERVICE: 
Looking for Quail Hunting 
lease or day leases. We pay 
top prices for our leases, 500 
acres and up. Call Allen 
800/552-9099. Serious 
inquiries only. 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 
Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler. Texas 

vote in the Match 13 Primary 

POLITICAL 
CALENDAR 

WHEELER 
REDI-MIX 

RI DI MIX CONCRETE 
SAND 

flashed Gravel-All Sizes 

Office Hours:7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 

HAY FOR SALE: East of 
Wheeler. 405-774-1175. 

5 acres minerals located 
in SE/4 Section 3. T 8N, R 
15W I.M., Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

67 Mineral acres located 
in W/2 E/2, SE/4 SE/4 
Section 33, T 11N, R 14W, 
I. M , Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

FOR RENT: Furnished 
trailer, 2 bedroom, 11/2  bath, 
central heat, clean. Call 
826-5634 or 826-3586. Ask 
for Donna. 

FOR SALE. New W.W. 
stock trailer, 806-826-5812. 

DEMOCRAT 

For 31st Jud. Dist. Judge: 
M. Kent Sims 

For CO. Judge: 
Wendell Morgan 

For Co. Clerk: 
Margaret Dorman 
Jimmy Hill 

For Co. Comm., Pct. 2: 
Bill Atherton 
K.D. Ford 
Tommy Puryear 
Arnold "Fat" Jones 

For Co. Attorney: 
Bobbye C. Hill 

REPUBLICAN 
For 31st Jud, Dist. Judge: 
J.A. "Gene" Martindale 

For Co. Attorney: 
Steven R. Emmert 

11.'0 Inc by each of the political 
candidates hated at part of their 
"political announcement-. tahich ran 

else*hcte in the paper I 

5 acres minerals located 
in W/2 NE/4 Section 1, T 
8N, R 16W. 1.M. Washita 
County, Oklahoma 

CLASSIFIED 
RATES: .002375 royalty interest in 

the W/2 SE/4 SE/4, SW/4 
SE/4, SE/4 SW/4 Section 
23, T 5N, R 4E, 1.M., 
Pontotoc County, Oklahoma 

FOR SALE: 1984 El Camino 
$4,500. Call 826-5741 after 
four. 

The Times perfers all 
classified ads be paid in 
advance, except for open 
ledger account customers. 

Cash and Ledger ac-
count: 15c word; $1.50 
minimum. (Ad paid when 
place or by 5:00 p.m. 
Wednesday of week ad 
runs.) 
Charge: 20c word; 52.00 
minimum. 

PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 
Houses or Land 

Paul Topper 
200 S. Canadian St. 

5 acres minerals located 
in SE/4, Section 5. T8N, R 
15W. I.M. Washita County. 
Oklahoma 

NOTICE TO PUBLIC 
Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing or reputation of 
any person, firm or corporation, 
which may appeal in the columns of 
this paper will be gladly corrected 
upon due notice being given to the 
editor personally at the office at 110 
East TIMM St., Wheeler, Texas. 

Wheeler. Tx. 

20 net mineral acres in the 
SW/4 NW/4 Section 3, T 
10N. R 14W, I.M., Washita 
County. Oklahoma Aluminum 

Self-Storing 
STORM-SCREEN 

WINDOWS 
Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable from inside. Easy r 
c leon..prow ler-proof .  Eliminate. 
draft., Cos fuel bills._ 

WHEELER LUMBER CO 

Pharr 826.5543 	Wheeler. 
-e In, h ne  Peardc 

to 

5 acres minerals located 
in SW/4, SE/4 NW/4, Sec-
tion 12, T 8N R 14W. I.M., 
Washita County, Oklahoma 

1/16 royalty interest in 
Lots 3 and 4 and the E/2 
SW/4 Section 1. T 11N, R 
18W, I.M. Washita County, 
Oklahoma 

CITY DUMP 
GROUND HOURS 

The Wheeler Times does not know-
ingly accept false or fraudulent 
advertaing or other advertising of an 
objectional nature, is printed in full 
confidence in the prisontation 
made Readers will center a favor it 
they will promptly report any failure 
on the part of the advertiser to make 

good any misrepresentation in our 

.dverbeemente. 

‘‘etlitesda‘ 
Fr .1,' . 1oltkril.1 \ 

tit 	Ill I' \I.  

Card of Thanks ... $3.75 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds: Noon Tues. 
Display: Noon Tuesday. 

5.9887 mineral acres 
located in Lots I to 24 in 

.0312505 working interest 
in the Pletcher No. I. Sec-
tion 53, Block AD, Wheeler 
County. Texas 

Continued Page 10 
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Office: 845-1002 

REASONABLE, SOUND PROTECTION 
for your home and other property, 

Rita Pearson: 375-2379 
David Pearson: 375-2379 

THERE'S MORE THAN ONE WAY 
TO SAY "I LOVE YOU' 

L 
Just call or visit us today 

to send the FTD® 
Hearts & Flowers® 

Bouquet. 
Or the FTD® 
Sweethearts 

Bouquet. 

Wheeler Flower & Gift Shop 
100 East Texas 	 Phone: 826-5943 	P 

I 

I,,,. Is of 	 itml 

Laverty. Aaron and Claudetta Laverty 
and Caaron and Willis and Verna 
Fillingim. 

Evelyn and Saundra Meek visited 
Jewell Holloman and Jean Pollack 
Friday and they went out to Maxey's 
to eat. 

Evelyn visited Karen and Grant 
Meek Sunday afternoon. 

Jean and Jewell were to spend 
Tuesday night with Evelyn. Kathy 
Meek was going to come and take 
them to the airport in Amarillo to fly to 
Maryland to Jean's home on Wed. 

Nice to have Charlie Phillis of White 
Deer stop by and eat lunch with us 
Monday. Charlie and Edie Phillis 

YHE WHEELER TIMES 

prayers. Suppose to take off work and 
rest more and wear her neck brace all 
the time, even sleeping and its hard 
and uncomfortable. 

Correction: (a line left out) Grand-
parents of Aspen Lace Hathaway are 
Paul and Clarise Hathaway and Bob 
and Zodell Swift. Great grandmothers 
are Addle Swift and Ruth Hathaway. 

We had rough games at Wheeler 
Friday night. Wheeler defeated Bris-
coe girls 72 to 23. Mandy Ferguson 
14, Tonya Blackburn 4. 

Briscoe boys defeated Wheeler 62 
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to 50, but most of shots had to be 
outside because of their height. Good 
Dallas was hitting his 3 pointers 
(made 7) Dallas 30, Kevin Sheilds 9. 
Ben, David and Danny 8 each. 

Briscoe Junior High girls defeated 
by Booker Saturday night won second 
in the Miami Tournament. Briscoe 
boys defeated by Higgins won second 
in the tournament also. 

Claudetta Laverty went to Okla-
homa City and met Barbie Laverty and 
brought Casey to visit them for 
awhile. 

visited Bob and Sue Ratliff last 
Saturday. 

Karla, Shelly, Bruce and Buddy 
Murray visited Carla Hector and 
tamily after school Friday. Carla 
Hector is working some in Jada's 
place at the Briscoe lunch room. 

We met Dr. Terence and Beth Cook 
for lunch at Shamrock Friday. We also 
visited with Mrs. Lela Simpson and 
Mrs. Nellie Lackey. Both looking 
good. Mrs. Simpson pretty perky for 
961/2 . Nice to see Carl and Audean 
Simpson there. Lela and Nellie are at 
Shamrock Care Inn. 

Ray Miller, pastor of Liberty Baptist 
Church in Amarillo, was a Wednesday 
night visitor to our Bible Study at 
Gageby Church. Ray also sells cancer 
insurance. 

Hello to Edith Donaldson! Hope you 
are feeling perky. 

Nice to have Melody Rodgers from 
Lubbock out to church Sunday. Also 
Casey Laverty from Decatur and Paula 

Listen to . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
VC' heeler. "'exit, 

Nice to see Mary Gayle Lewis and 
Justin and Mary's parents, Cliff and 

't Mary Lewis and Patsy Franks all from 
Borger out to Luby's Thursday. Mary 
is substitute teaching in some of the 
schools around here. 
Paula Reed and Samantha, Bernie 
Tapp and Deleise Quinton and Jill 
Johnson met us for lunch Thursday at 
Luby's. Good to see and visit with 
everyone. 

Happy Birthday to Kelly Paul on 
February 11, Tina Watson and Scott 
Watson on Feb. 12, Cathy Hunt and 
Leesa Watson on Feb. 13, Jeff 
Thompson, Jeromy Childress. Nelda 
Dukes, Don Zumstein and Cindy 
Zumstein on Feb. 14, Teressa Currie, 
Richard Laverty, Cliff Hefley and 
Russell Laverty on Feb. 15. Mattie 
Jackson on Feb. 16, Verline Currie on 
Feb. 17. 

Happy Anniversary to Grant and 
Karen Meek on Feb. 14. 

Sunday dinner guests at the home 
of Roy and Lois Meadows were 
Carolan and Virginia Aycock, Beedie 

tf 

BRISCOE MENU 	Feb. 12-16 

MONDAY: Breakfast; Cereal, fruit, 
milk, juice. 
Lunch; Salisbury steak, potatoes, 
green beans, brownies, milk, rolls. 
TUESDAY: Breakfast; Donuts, rolls, 
milk, juice. 
Lunch; Pizza, salad, jello w/fruit, 
milk. 
WEDNESDAY: Breakfast; Sausage, 
gravy, biscuits, milk, juice. 
Lunch; Tacos, salad, Spanish rice, 
milk, pies. 
THURSDAY: Breakfast; Waffles, 
bacon, milk, juice. 
Lunch; Lasagna, salad, broccoli, cake, 
milk, rolls. 
FRIDAY: Breakfast; Malt-O-Meal. 
toast, milk, juice. 
Lunch; Chili dogs, French fries, fruit, 
milk, cookies. 

Carpenter from Hardesty and Julie 
Gilmer from W.T. and Cheryl Hudson 
from Plainview. 

The Briscoe-Allison High School 
boys game was very close and exciting 
all the way—anyone's game till the 
last whistle. Briscoe won 68 to 66 by 
all of the boys working together and 
playing very good ball. Ben Meadows 
18, Kevin Sheilds and Dallas Fillingim 
14 each, David Gilmer 11, Dusty 
Walker 1, and Danny Nelson 10. 
Allison girls defeated Briscoe girls. 
There was a very large crowd with 
people from Wheeler and Mobeetie 
and other places. Very noisy. 

Pauline Hefley, Isabel Moore and I 
enjoyed having lunch together at 
Maxey's Tuesday. Pauline and Isabel 
have been very good friends since 
fourth grade days. 

Last Sunday supper guests at the 
home of Grant and Karen Meek and 
Eddie were Raymond and Isabel 
Moore and Garland and Rachel 
Moore. They were celebrating Ray-
mond's birthday, 39 and holding. 

Last basketball game of the season 
is at Miami Friday. Feb. 9. Be a good 
game! 

Nice to have supper at Maxey's 
Tuesday night with Brad and Sue 
Chandler and Jana and Bridget. 

Nice to see Coach Jerry Brown's 
parents from Hardesty out to Tuesday 
night games at Allison. Also got to see 
Lisa (Craig) Farmer and Ryan and 
Mathew from Pampa there. Jerry's 
fiancee. Paula Carpenter was out to 
Saturday's games. 

You missed some great games at 
Miami Thursday night if you weren't 
there. Briscoe Jr. High boys defeated 
Pringle-Morse 46 to 22. All got to play 
and did good. David Hale 24, Jimmy 
Nelson 6, Joshua Purcell and Cory 
Kinnaman 5 each, Bruce Mize 4 and 
Tye Ferguson 2. They really are 
improving. The girls game was much 
tougher but Briscoe won 28 to 24. 
Lindsey Fillingim 16, Shelly Hunt 6, 
Misty Walker 4, Keri Nelson 2, but all 
are improving and doing great. 

Briscoe Junior High girls and boys 
defeated Miami girls and boys Satur-
day noon to get a chance at Saturday 
night finals. In the girls game, Briscoe 
trailed 7 to 16 at the half but came 
back and won 27 to 25. Shelly Hunt 13, 
Lindsey Fillingim 14 and Brandi 
Luttrell 1. 

In the boys game, Briscoe defeated 
Miami 24 to 13. David Hale 14, Cory 
Kinnaman 5, Jimmy 4 and Joshua 
Purcell 1. 

Connie and Rich Irvine and Justin 
and Bryant Brook were weekend 
visitors to Dick and Ruth Irvine. 

Butch took Jada Murray back to 
Oklahoma City Friday for check-up. 4 
months since her injury and still 
hurting bad. Remember her in your 

Why wait for 
your federal 

income tax refund? 

tasfund 
• receive your refund anticipation loan in a 

matter of days 
II no cash needed—all fees can be withheld 

from your check 

• available whether we prepare your return 
or not 

H&R BLOCK® 
509 Maki [P.O. Box 411] — Wheeler, Texas 79096 

PH: 826-3736 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
TO TAX PERSONAL PROPERTY 

p 

The Mobeetie I.S.D. will hold a public hearing on a proposal 
to tax the following non-business personal property: 

All Cars, boats, pick-ups, trucks and trailers. 

To tax the above property, the Mobeetie I.S.D. must approve 
the proposal by ordinary resolution or order and must find that 

the taxation of property as proposed will be in the public interest 
of all residents of Mobeetie I.S.D. 

4 

4 

The Public hearing will be held on Thursday, February 8, 1990 
at 7:00 P.M. in Mobeetie H.S. Library. 

All interested persons may speak at the meeting and present 
evidence for or against this proposal. 

MOBEETIE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
P.O. Box 177 

Mobeetie, TX 79061-0177 
806/845-2301 



BEN FRAN K LI N®  

408 S. Main 	Phone: 826-5868 

Wheeler, Texas 

IS NOW . . . 

V&Q .  Variety 
cf/ mores  

ELECT 

TOMMY PURYEAR 
COUNTY COMMISSIONER PRCT. #2 

DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY MARCH 13. 1990 

YOUR VOTE AND SUPPORT APPRECIATED 

(POL. ADV. PAID FOR BY TOM G PURYEAR 
CAMPAIGN CHAIRMAN P.0 BOX 299. WHEELER, TEXAS 79096) 

Wheeler  Church of Christ 
Congregational Concerns: 
The men's monthly business 

meeting will be held on this coming 
Monday night, February 12th, at 
7:30 P.M. in the multi-purpose 
building. Before the meeting 
begins, a fellowship meal will be 
held. This meal will be served at 
7:00. All men of the congregation 
are encouraged to attend the meal 
and business meeting. 

The Bjble lectureship, which is 
annually held at Abilene Christian 
University, is scheduled for Sun-
day, February 18th, through Wed-
nesday, February 21st. The theme 
of this lectureship will be: "Luke: 
A Gospel for the World". A 
schedule of the classes and lectures 
is posted on the bulletin board in 
the lobby. 

Saturday, February 10th is the 
date of the Ladies Love Luncheon. 

From Sunday, March 4th, 
through Wednesday, March 7th, 
this congregation will conduct a 
gospel meeting. John McCourt, 

associate minister of the Southwest 
Church of Christ in Amarillo, will 
be the preacher for this meeting. 

The names of the men who have 
been asked to serve in the Sunday 
worship services are posted on the 
bulletin board in the lobby. If any 
man cannot serve, he is asked to 
notify Chris Osborne. 

Bea Smotherman's sister has 
been hospitalized in Oklahoma 
City, suffering with a stroke. Her 
condition is slowly improving. 

Sympathy must be expressed to 
Doyle Pond and his family due to 
the recent death of his father. The 
funeral was held last Thursday 
morning in Canyon. 

This congregation recently 
received a letter from High Plains 
Children's Home, expressing ap-
preciation for the financial support 
that this congregation has given to 
them. According to their records, 
this congregation gave $1,950.00 in 
1989. This letter is posted on the 
bulletin board in the lobby. 

From The Minister's Desk: 
As I was recently driving in 

Amarillo, I saw a large neon sign 
that read: "MOIFL". I was puzzled 
about the meaning of the sign until 
I realized that some letters on the 
sign were not correct. By properly 
placing two horizontal lines --above 
the I and at the bottom of the F ---
the sign then read: "Motel". 

This sign reminded me of a great 
truth. It reminded me that human 
perception can be imperfect. And 
this imperfection can be seen in 
several aspects of life. For exam-
ple--- 

We often imperfectly perceive 
other people. Our perception of 
other people is usually two dimen-
sional. We perceive people as they 
are and as they could have been. 
We do not perceive people as they 
could be. And when we perceive 
people as they are, we judge them. 
When we perceive people as they 
could have been, we sym-
pathetically understand them. But 
when we perceive people as they 
could be, we love them. 

This is the perception that God 
had of us. Rornans 5:8 says: "--God 
demonstrates His own love toward 
us, in that while we were yet 
sinners, Christ died for us." God 
saw us as sinners, but He loved us, 
believing that by an obedient faith 
in His crucified Son we could be 
His children. The Apostle Paul 
wrote: "--When the fullness of 
time came, God sent forth His Son, 
born of a woman, born under the 
Law, in order that we might receive 
the adoption as sons. And because 
you are sons, God has sent forth 
the Spirit of His Son into hearts, 
crying Abba! Father! Therefore 
you arc no longer a slave, but a 
son; and if a son, then a heir 

through God." (Galatians 4:4-7) 
Beginning immediately, let's be 

careful with our perception of other 
people. Let's love them as God 
loves them, perceiving them as 
they could be. 

We also often imperfectly per-
ceive the real issues of life. Our 
primary concern is an accumulation 
of material goods. And as we 
ambitiously pursue these goods, 
we neglect the most important 
issues of life---friends, family, and 
God. 

It is not a sin to be materially 
prosperous, but it is a sin to 
achieve such prospersity at the 
expense of spiritual principles and 
physical health. The Apostle Paul 
clearly emphasized the real issues 
of life when he wrote: "--Godliness 
actually is a means of great gain, 
when accompained by contentmen-
t. For we have brought nothing into 
the world, so we cannot take 
anything out of it either. And if we 
have food and covering with these 
we shall be content. But those who 
want to get rich fall into temptation 
and a snare and many foolish and 
harmful desires which plunge men 
into ruin and destruction." (I 
Timothy 6:6-9) 

We are extremely foolish when 
our perception of the real issues of 
life and other people is imperfect. 
We are like a tired and sleepy man 
who is taking a long and difficult 
trip. As he drives, he seeks a place 
of rest. He finally sees a sign that 
says, "MOIFL", but he does not 
perceive that the letters have been 
incorrectly placed. And instead of 
discovering a motel, he sees only a 
meaningless sign, causing him to 
continue a meaningless trip to a 
useless destination. 

Bill Morrison, Minister 
Church of Christ 
Wheeler, Texas 

An Invitation: 
YOU are cordially invited to 

attend any of the weekly services 
of the Wheeler Church of Christ 
which meets at 1001 S. Alan 
Bean Blvd. in Wheeler, Texas. 

Services 
Sunday Bible Study 10:00 A.M. 
Sunday Morning Worship 11:00 A.M. 
Sunday Night Worship 6:00 P.M. 
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 P.M. 

PO WI 117//7 	/ 	 1:// 072/72Z, 	 Z/ZSZ /7., 

(Marginal Note) : Middle age is 
when you've met so many people that 
every new person you meet reminds 
you of sonic one else: 

Ruben and Edna May and Edith 
Donaldson ate Sunday dinner at the 
Hill Top Cafe at Reydon, and Edith 
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Son 
net,. 

n't It The Truth I 
By Ab  (punter 1P1 

Visited with Ruben and Edna Sunday 
afternoon at their home. Others 
visiting was Clarence and Irene 
Zybach from Briscoe. 

Pete and Margaret Gilmer visited 
Ann Boydston and Natalie and Jessica 
last Saturday. 

Loyd and Nona Jones was in Pampa 
one day last week on business and 
also did some shopping. They came 
back through Wheeler visited Jim 
Garner at Parkview Hospital in 
Wheeler and then came by Colic and 
Vetola Parker's and visited with them. 
Loyd and Nona was Sinday dinner 
guest with Lee and Sharon Hall and 
family. 

Ruth Chadwick returned home last 

Dr. Jack L. Rose 
OPTOMETRIST 

121 Main St.—Shamrock 
Phone: 256-3203 

Tues.: 9-5 	 Fri.: 2-5 

By Christine Gilmer 
Nahum 1-3 & 7: 

The Lord is slow to anger, and great 
in power, and will not at all acquit the 
wicked: the Lord hath His ways in the 
whirlwind and in the storm, and the 
clouds are the dust of His feet. 

The Lord is good, a strong hold in 
the day of trouble; and He knoweth 
them that trust in Him. 

Seems we have a touch of winter 
every weekend then back to warm 
spring like days, after the cold days 
makes us appreciate the warm days 
more. 

Betty Dyer spent a week recently in 
Amarillo with her daughter Betty Ann 
Dyer. Betty is my new next door 
neighbor. 

Had a little chat with Laura Fern 
Selby a few days ago at Thriftway in 

Listen to . . . 

I'm one of them birds that believe 
everything I see on the Boob Tube and 
we got more low cholesterol stuff in 
the house than you would believe. We 
got Oat Branitis and we got to using 
that sugar substitute and Mama 
planned on making a cake that called 
for several cups of sugar and we 
started openin up that sugar substi-
tute and 1 said "Wo, Mama, it would 
cost lebenteen dollars to fill up that 
many cups with that substitute" 
Mania got out the lumpy sugar that 
we had stuck back for many months 
and made the cake. Tasted good and 
come to find out that substitute stuff 

off the 
found 

Wheeler she is still having quite a lot 
of problems with her leg, the one that 
she broke her hip a few months ago. 
Do hope things are soon better for 
her. 

Nice Monday morning here in 
Allison, sunshine and south wind. 
The groundhog didn't see his shadow 
here Feb. 2nd, groundhog's day, for 
whatever that means, me, I don't 
think has a thing to do with our 
weather. 

Glen and Tina Morgan from Ama-
rillo spent the weekend with J.R. and 
Leota Black. 

Lisa Farmer, Ryan and Matthew 
from Pampa visited Sunday with Ruby 
Craig and also spent Sunday night. 
Tanner McWhorter from Wheeler 
spent the weekend with Ruby. 

Opal and Juanita Boydston visited 
Robbie and SaRita Green and Carissa 
at Ardmore, OK. last Friday night and 
Saturday. 

Bill and Kay Donaldson weekend 
guests were Allen and Vicki Donald-
son and Ashley from Amarillo and 
Jimmy and Dawn Donaldson and 
family, Loyd and Nona Jones also 
visited Sunday afternoon. 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
W heeler. Tex as 

Saturday from a trip at Kennewick, 
Washington where she had spent over 
three weeks with her daughter 
Rhonda Puryear and family. Rhonda 
had surgery and Ruth was there to 
help take care of the family. She was 
glad to get back home, but was tired. 

Those attending a dinner Sunday at 
the U.P. Church fellowship hall for 
Steve and Lynette O'Donnel, Monica 
and Kimberly were Bruce and Pearl 
Harrison, Vivian Wallace from Elk 
City, Edell Tedford and Grace Henson 
from Amarillo, Gary and Julie Boyd-
ston, Heather and Jason, Henry and 
Cheryl Dupont, Sabrina and Cody, 
Melissa, Melody, Jonathan and Justin 
Walker, Opal and Juanita Boydston, 
Nellie Long and Thursia Poindexter 
from Cheyenne, Clifton and Louise 
Boydston and Henry and Dora Lea 
Dupont from Okay, Ok., and Ona 
Black. The O'Donnels left last Tues. 
by plane from Okla. City for Hong 
Kong China. They are going there as 
missionaries. Will be there for four 

L. & F. REPAIR 
ZENITH T.V."s 	R.C.A. T.V.'s 

SATELLITE ANTENNA SYSTEMS 

FRANK E. COATES. OWNER 

P.O. Box 220 
WHEELER. TEXAS 79096 

PHONE 8067826-3241 
110 W. OKLA. ST. 

was goin to be taken 
market. 	They 
out it caused Rickets in Hawaiian 
Butterflies, boy wuz we fooled. 

Mama makes homegrown bread 
from scratch, what I mean by scratch 
is she uses a pinch of this and a dab of 
that kind of scratch. When she gets 
the loaves a rising she gets out the 
cookie sheets and puts little wads of 
dough on the sheet ana it will rise and 
fill the kitchen with the most delicious 
oder you could believe, my mouth is 
waterin now and the bread ain't even 
ready yet. I ain't got any idea how 
many cholesterols are in it but I doubt 
if they had invented them cholesterols 
when Mama got the bread recipe from 
her Grandma. 
Not long ago some friend told me 

that I shouldn't use salt on my fried 
eggs and recommended some substi-
tute so I got one of them two dollar 
ninty eight cents substitutes and 
thought I would try it and thought I 
would read what it had in it and there 
were things I never heard of and after 
reading the side affects I put the lid 
back on it and stuck it in the cabinet. 
One of my Greatgrandpas traded an 
Old Cherokee Chief sive sacks of, salt 
for the old chiefs 15. yr. old daughter, 
she may have only been 14 but she 
became my great grandmother and if 
it hadn't of been for the salt I might 
not have been here. 

Speaking of believing.everything I 
see on TV, well the other nite they 
wuz talking bout all the low cholester-
ol items that you cen get at the 
supermarket and guess what? I went 
to the Mall a couple of mornings ago 
and rite there on the shelves there it 
was; I got me an introductory six pack 
of Low Cholesterol Bathroom Tissue... 
mater of fact it didn't have one 
cholesterol in the whole pack, will let 
you know bout it soon. What a 
breakthrough? 

See you next week. 
Love to all, 

Ab and Mama 

years. Henry and Dora Lea was 
overnight guests last Saturday night 
with Ona Black. Glen and Nona 
Elmore attended the funeral of Glen's 
sister Loma Dickson at Ft. Smith, Ark. 
last week. Ray and Sue Giddens 
visited Glen and Nona last Saturday 
night. Kathy Zybach, Clay and Casey 
from Briscoe' visited Glen and Nona 
Sunday afternoon. 

Bessie Giddens weekend guests 
were Jack and Arlene Scheller and 
Sharon and Kevin Slelton, Jaclyn and 
Katie Jo from Amarillo and Doug 
Scheller from Canyon. 

Pete and Margaret Gilmer and 
Mabel Parker celebrated Pete and 
Margaret's birthdays last Thurs. by 
eating dinner at Maxey's Steakhouse 
at Wheeler. 

Louis and Rita Grayson visited 
Rita's sister and husband Doris and 
Jack Hays at Wheeler last Thurs. 
night, another sister and husband Mr. 
and Mrs. J.P. Johnston from Borger 
was also visiting. 

Bruce and Pearl Harrison spent 
from Wednesday afternoon until Fri-
day afternoon at Elk City with Jimmy 
and Vivian Wallace. Bruce also saw 
the doctor while there. Sunday night 
guests at Bruce and Pearls was Vivian 
Wallace, Steve and Lynette O'Donnel, 
Monica and Kimberly. Edell Tedford 
and Grace Henson visited Bruce and 
Pearl Sunday afternoon and went back 
home to Amarillo Sunday night after 
church. 

Verne and Susie Lohberger attend-
ed a S.C. meeting at San Antonio, TX. 
for several days last week. They also 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Joe Steele while 
there Joe took them all out to eat to 
celebrate Susie's birthday. 

Vance and Caroline Boydston and 
Dick and Cletus Green and family 
gave a anniversary dinner for Roy and 
Lanora Morse at their home last 
Sunday. Others there were Kevin 
Boydston and Roy Green from Ama-
rillo and Monica Gray and Jonathan 
and Kyle Boydston and Jamie Green 
and Jo Robinson. 

Virginia Puryear and her sister-in-
law Jane Carter from Wheeler shop-
ped in Clinton, OK. last Tuesday. 

We are glad Edith Levitt has come 
back to her home here. I believe I 
heard she got home January 29th. She 
had spent about two months at 
McAllen, TX. with her daughter and 
husband Evelyn and Roy Lankford. 

(Marginal Note): The smallest good 
deed is better than the grandest good 
intention. 

Mickey M. Pride, CPA an- 
nounces the opening of an 
accounting office in 
Shamrock, Texas at 208 N. 
Madden [next door to Post 
Office] offering accounting 
and bookkeeping services, 
tax planning and prepara- 
tion. 

Maryiln Clemens, Manager 
806-256-5378 

RODGERS WEDDING SHOWER 
There was a nice crowd out to the 

wedding shower for Timm and 
Melody Rodgers Saturday night at 
Briscoe, in spite of most Briscoe 
people going to Miami to watch 
Briscoe (both) Junior High teams play 
in the finals. They got a real nice 
shower. Some there were Timm's 
parents, Buck and Elaine Rodgers and 
his grandmothers, Elsie Glazner and 
Arizona Rodgers, Kay Moore, 
Lawrence Schmucke, Mary Kennedy, 
Ray and Pat Hudson, Cheryl Hudson, 
Ma Mary Hudson, Verna Fillingim, 
Ruth Irvine, Bryant Brock, Gay 
Purcell, Lori Baird, Tina Lehman, 
Tonya Blackburn, Lacy Walker, 
Martha Meek, Phoebe Hartline and 
Tamara, Lois Meadows, Evelyn 
Meek, Winnie Gilmer, Garland 
Harris, Phyllis Hefley, Lou Dean 
Douthit. Many others sent gifts. 

Timm Rodgers goes to school at 
Tech, but was home for National 
Guard at Shamrock. Randy and Andy 
Singleton also had national guard 
there. 

GAGEBY SINGING 
We were really blessed by all the 

good singing Sunday night and enjoy-
ed each visitor. Hope you will all come 
back next time March 4 at 6:30. Some 
singing were Tony Griffin, Micah 
Perry. Ann Killingsworth, Peggy 
Bryant, and Michael Killingsworth 
accompanied by Rachel Moore on the 
piano, Andy and April Finstenvald, 
Doris Finstenvald, Claudy and Ina 
Mae Brotherton, Gladys Kysar and 
Lois Meadows, Evelyn Meek, Winnie 
Gilmer and Pat Hudson. Claudetta 
and Caaron Laverty had a puppet 
show with good singing. Darryle Perry 
gave his testimony. Willis played the 
harmonica. Carolan Aycock led a 
song. Winnie led some congregational 
songs. All was so good. Other visitors 
included Vaughn and Alice Lister, 
Rev. Jerry Ralston, Tom Bryant, Pearl 
Abernathy, Audra Christopher, all 
from Kelton, Carrie Perry from Sen-
tinel. Okla., Tressa Perry and Doretta 
Moore. Phoebe Hartline will be in 
charge next time March 4, 6:30. 
Visitors always welcomed warmly. 

THANK YOU 
The WHEELER LIVESTOCK BOOSTERS 

would like to thank the following individuals and 

businesses for their support at our pie and cake 

auction. 

Jim Batton 
	 Dan Kenney 

Frankenbery Texaco 
	Margaret Dorman 

Toni Kuchler 
	 Van Baize 

Thomas Helton 
	

Dick DeArment 

Kenneth McCasland 
	

Dewayne Baker 

Pam Hibler 
	

Richard Wallace 

Carolyn Sabbe 	Johnny's Shamrock 

Roy Don Chick 
	

Johnny Velasquez 

Tommy Puryear 
	

Fat Jones 

Harrison Hall 
	

John David Wright 

Jim Hill 
	

Brenda Childress 

Bobbye Hill 
	

Larry Porton 

Fred Goad 
	

Thriftway 

Gary Hardcastle 
	Bob Stiles 

K. D. Ford 
	

Gail Ledbetter 

M. Kent Sims 
	Greg Smith 

First National Bank in Wheeler 

WEIGHT WATCHERS COMING 
Weight Watchers is coming the 

end of February. Contact Machille 
Henson 826.5665 after 5. 

I AMERICAN 
ti CANCER 

SOCIETY 
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Turn Your 
Radio On! 

Happy 39th 

S 

SOUTHWEST 
BALE LOADERS 

Southwest Bale Loaders can be operated entirely 
from the cab of a vehicle. 

These unique big bale loaders coma in a 12 volt 
hydraulic cylinder model. 

$pcars can he removed and used for tho 3 point of the tractor. 

Loader s800°° Freight $5600 

Installation Available 
Omega Grain, Inc. 

Box 157 — [806] 826-5953 	Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Are you 
about to 
REPLACE. 
EQUIPMENT?  
Make your best deal and then see us! 

Your local Production Credit Association for 
a limited time has fixed rate farm equipment loans 
for up to 5 years at 0 75 0/ 

to 

See Canadian PCA today! 

C-Imidhul TX 
s063: 14,4n: 

rmur), TN 
SCt,tt; 17,;7 

['err \ ton. TX 
tio.-4;-6526 
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Robert M. Horne et ux 1-25.90 N50' 
Sec 1 Blk LXVIII Shamrock 

JANUARY 31, 1990 
CORR AOL—Barrett W. Pierce to 

Damun Oil Company 1-25.90 See 
Instrument 

MD—Glenda I. Fletcher to Bessie 
L. Laycock 12-1.89 W/2 Sec 4 J. 
Poitevent Survey 

APP SUB TRUSTEE—First 

National Bank in Wheeler to Rhonda 
Windham 1-31-90 NW/4 Sec 57 Blk 17 

FEBRUARY 1, 1990 
RELEASE PAVING LIEN—City of 

Wheeler to Billie V. Atherton 1-22-90 
90'of 	Blk 43 Stanley Add., 
Wheeler 

OL—Mobil Producing Texas & New 
Mexico, Inc. to Excel Production 
Company 1-29.90 N/2 Sec 56 Blk 24 

ASSIGN—Mobil Producing Texas 
& New Mexico, Inc. to Excell Produc-
tion Company 1-29-90 S/2 Sec 43 Blk 
24 N/2 Sec 56 Blk 24 

DISTRICT CLERK'S FILINGS 
#9193—John W. Locke vs Jackie 

Woodruff & Nell Woodruff d/b/a J & 
N Production Company, 1-26-90, Ac-
counting of Royalties on Gas Lease 

#9194—In the Interest of a Minor 
Child, 1-30-90, IV-D Support 

ALLISON MENU 
MONDAY: Lunch; Chicken strips, 
mashed potatoes, English peas, hot 
rolls, ice cream. 
TUESDAY: Lunch; Spaghetti, tossed 
salad. okra, Texas toast. 
WEDNESDAY: Lunch; Pigs -N-Blan-
ket, macaroni & cheese, blackeyed 
peas. jello. 
THURSDAY: Lunch; Turkey & dress-
ing, green beans, mashed potatoes, 
fruit salad, hot rolls. 
FRIDAY: Lunch; Hamburgers. 
French fries, fruit. 

S 

HAYMAN CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 
28th & Perryton Parkway Pampa, Texas 

Phone 665-7261 
Dr. Mark W. Ford, Jr. 	 Dr. Louis Haydon 

day then took her out to eat at 
Maxey's Steakhouse, now that was 
nice. Eunice said they were coming 
down this next weekend. Marie is 
retiring, sounded like they will come 
down more. 

Mona Reynolds came down to help 
Marie and David move, Marie and 
David ate dinner Saturday with Essie 
and the boys. 

Marie and David are moving to 
Wheeler they are moving in the house 
that Mattie Atherton use to live in. 

I understand Bill Finsterwald 
bought Marie Wright's house. 

Essie went to Wheeler got her a 
new permanent, now that was nice. 

Kyla Walker said about all they did 
were go to ballgames. I can remember 
back there that was about all we got 
done. But I sure enjoyed it, especially 
if I had a kid playing. 

Mae Welch visited Mary Hudson 
Monday. 

Pat and Mary went to Wheeler 
today Thursday and shopped. 

Mary is piecing quilts these days a 
good job. 

Mary heard from Oden and Lois 
today, they were doing lust fine. Leroy 
and Lavern were out there now. Now 
that helps to have some kids around. 

Purcells going to ball games, also 
Gaye said. 

Rosalie Keelin is resting up some 
here of lately. 

Hoyle Helton is having some teeth 
work done, what I need. 

Darren Brown is visiting his grand-
parents, Hoyle and J.O.. He visited us 

Listen to . . . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
Wheeler. thew.  

Monday, 29—A nice day. 

Janice (Kelly) boy, 13 ro 14 years 
old, Jerod, was at Borger at a rodeo, I 
think, got thrown in the air. He landed 
on his head. He is getting better by 
the day. Janice is with him. Mattie 
said he was hurt Wednesday. I didn't 
get the details. 

Charlene Rainy brought her parent-
s, George and Avis Parker, out to see 
Colie today, Monday. Colie was not 
here. Nelson and Zetha took him for a 
ride. They went to Hanron Cemetery, 
where his granddad Parker was 
buried. Could not find it. 

Doc Wilhelm also came Monday. 
He had shopped for us. Colie was 
gone. 

A pickup hit this Jerod. The pickup 
did not have lights. 

Our visitors Wednesday were 
Darren Brown, Red and Anna Duke, 

Clyde and Minnie Bell Venson and 
Gena Zybach. 

Scotty Parker came Tuesday, spent 
the night, took our last horse to 
Dumas to sell. That the last horse and 
last cow—don't know how I am going 
to stand this if I had my 2 knees, I 
could not. 

Zetha went home Wednesday 
evening, hope to come back Monday. 

We hated to hear Glen Elmore in 
Allison community, sister passed 
away. Our sympathy goes out to her 
relatives and friends, she will be 
missed. Didn't get any details. 

Thursday real rainy like, looks like 
we had a shower this morning. 

N. F. Young came this morning, 
Thursday to check on Colie. 

Colie had Gene Ferguson for a 
visitor today. 

Marie and her husband came down 
took Eunice Edwards to church Sun- 

Sunday, we almost didn't reconiz( 
him, he had grew up and changed sc. 
much. 

I use to call down there to Hoyles 
he would answer the phone. I'd sad 
what do you know, he was little, he 
say I don't know anything, I'd say dc 
you know the world is round, he'd say 
yes. So he got to saying when I would 
ask what do you know, he would say 
the world is round, ha, he was a tiny 
guy then. 

At midnight last night a cloud came 
over from north, a lot of thunder and 
lightening. We got a shower of rain 
lasted less than five minutes, it went 
on south roaring. I heard no more rain 
this morning at 7:00. I woke our 
ground is (white) covered with hail. 

It sure did rain that 5 minutes. 
N.F. went home last night he didn't 

want to get snowed in down here —
ha. 

I got cold in the night, I pulled every 
thing over me I could get hold of, I 
woke so hot, hair all wet it must have 
gotten cold in the night, then got hot, 
it don't look cold outside. 

Think one reason Zetha went home 
whe was afraid she would get snowed 
in down here. 

Bobby James and April called 
yesterday from Louisiana, they said it 
was raining there and had for days. I 
told him send some this way, he said 
he sure wished he could. 

Today is ground hog day, don't 
think he will see his shadow here 
today. So we will have pretty weather. 
I don't think he knows what he is 
doing. 

Barry Helton with the 49'ers is J.O. 
and Mattie, Alice, Effie and Ed's 
great Nephew II. Don't know what you 
call him. He is Perry Heltons Jr's boy, 
nephew of J.O.'s. Barry started his 
athletic career in Simla, Colo. out of 
the Rocky Mountian News, he still 
have Colorado roots. His wife is Lisa. 

Dennis Weaver best known as 
Chester in Gunsmoke, is building a 
house in Colo. that use old tires and 
aluminum cans, he is building this 
house on 21 acres of his west of 
Ridgway. 

Pete and Joyce Luttrell of Sawyer, 
Kansas visited his sister and family 
Lou Dean and K. D. Douthit on this 
past weekend. 

Lou Dean and K. D. Douthit visited 
Roy and Willene Waters in Pampa last 

OLD MOBEET1E ASSOCIATION 
MEET FEB. 1990 

List of instruments filed in Wheeler 
County Clerk's office for the week of 
January 26 thru February 1, 1990 

JANUARY 26, 1990 
AOL—Suzanne S. Curtis to South 

Elmwood One, Inc. 1-25-90 See 
Instrument 

C/C WILL AND ORDER—Arthur 
Dan Selman to Ex Parte 11-21-89 

MERGER—Pacific Enterprises 
Royalty Co. to Pacific Enterprises Oil 
Co. (USA) 1-11-90 

RDT—First Bank & Trust to Carl 
Martin 1-23-90 Lots 5&6 Bik F Potts 
Add Shamrock 

D—Martin Family Trust to Fern 
Turnbow Poer 1-4-90 Lots 5&6 Blk F 
Potts Add Shamrock 

AFF—Fern Turnbow Poer to 
Joseph M. Martin 1-23-90 

D—Fern Turnbow Poer et vir to 
Lenny C. Smith et ux 1-23-90 Lots 5&6 
Blk F Potts Add Shamrock 

AOL—Gifford Operating Co. et al to 

First Sidney Corp. 12-21-89 W/2 Sec 2 
Blk 5 B&B Survey 

JANUARY 29, 1990 
C/C PROB—Perry Helton to Ex 

Parte 1-11-90 
DT—M. Earle Webb to Amarillo 

National Bank, Amarillo, Texas 
1-26-90 See Instrument 

D—James R. Harrison to Betty J. 
Hughes 1-11-90 20.10 acs. SW/4 Sec 
67 Blk 17 

SPECIAL D—Johnny Rhodes to 
Gordon Dougherty 1-26-90 Lots 13-24 
Blk XXII Lots 1-12 Blk XXIII Romans 
Add Shamrock 

EXT DT—W.V. Lister et ux to 
Canadian Production Credit 
Association 1-23-90 

ROW—Rose E. Brashears to 
American Telephone & Telegraph Co. 
1- -90 Pt NW/4 Sec 57 Blk 17 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
George Gabriel 1-8-90 Sec 48 Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Richard Harberts 1-8-90 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Michael Hoffman et ux 11-29-89 Sec 
48 Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Silvene Bracalente 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 

WHEELER 
PLUMBING 511 S. Cheyenne 

THANK YOU 
We wish to express our gratitude to the volunteers of the Fire 
Departments of Wheeler, Kelton, Allison, Briscoe, Mobeetie, 

Shamrock, Sweetwater, Cheyenne and Reydon for their quick 
response and actions in controlling and extinguishing the grass fire on our 

,ranches January 30. Thanks also to the Wheeler County Volunteer 
Ambulance Service, the Wheeler County Sheriff's Department, all those 
running maintainers and water trucks, and the individuals who pitched in 
to keep the fire from restarting Without all your efforts, the fire would 
have been much more extensive and damaging. Thank you 

The Stiles Ranch 
	

The Britt Ranch 

Gordon Stiles 
	

David & Paula Britt 

Bob & Sue Stiles 
	

Dave & Mary Britt 

Bill & Kay Stiles 
	

Louis & Jenny Britt 

Sandra Christner 
	

Ray & Sue Giddens 

Bob & Sharon Swindler 
	

Casey Cameron 

J. C & Patty Brooks 

0 

New Construction 

Remodel 

Repair 

Sewer Service 

Phone: 826-5907 
FREE ESTIMATES 

MAX McQUEEN 
P.O. Box 754 — Wheeler, Texas 

Saturday. Their daughter Pat 
Railsback of Amarillo was also there. 
Willene is out of the hospital at the 
present time. 

Kirbie Kinnaman spent Sunday 
night with Ma-Ma and Pa-Pa Douthit. 

Tressa Perry visited relatives in 
Oklahoma this past weekend. 

FREE ESTIMATES 
	

24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

McCAIN'S AUTO BODY 
117 W.-OKLAHOMA BOX 65 WHEELER, TX 79096 

PH. 806/826-3433 

INSURANCE CLAIMS 
	

OWNER: BOB McCAIN 

TEEN DANCE 
Old Jay Cee Gym—Shamrock 

February 17 	9-12 
8th Grade, High School and Up 

Admission $4.00 

• 

COLLINGSWORTH GENERAL HOSPITAL 

Collingsworth Home Heath Agency, serving people in 
Collingsworth, Wheeler, Hall, and Donley Counties, provide 
services for the home bound. These services include Skilled Nursing 
Visits by licensed personal, Home Health Aid for personal care, and 
Physical Therapy by a registered therapist. 

For more information contact our office located in Collingsworth 
General Hospital or telephone (806) 447-2521 Ext. 304. 

Jackie Sanderson, R.N. 
Beulah Powell, L.V.N. 
Jeanne Hale, L.V.N. 
Bonnie Smith, Physical Therapist 
Bernice Brown. H.H.A. 
Sara Hernandez, Secretary 

A-3 
AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 

Stephen G. Burg 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
W.K. Doran 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to Bill 
E. Galbreth 11-29-89 Sec 48 Mk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Wulf K. Knausenberger 11-29-89 Sec 
48 Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Jack L. Middleton 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Walter W. Pollack, Jr. 11-29-89 Sec 48 
Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Theodore R. Samuels 11-29-89 Sec 48 
Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Joseph W. Tasler 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Joseph Robert Theismann 11-29-89 
Sec 48 Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
James E. Ticer 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to Carl 
H. Wichmann et ux 11-29-89 Sec 48 
Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
John S.C. Yee et ux 11-29-89 Sec 48 
Blk A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
Dena Fern Keeler 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

AOL—Rylee Petroleum, Inc. to 
W.G. Plueckhahn 11-29-89 Sec 48 Blk 
A-3 

MML—Don J. Holbrook et ux to 
Custom Vinyl Siding, Inc. 11-12-89 Lot 

p 

SHEPARDS NURSING AGENCY 
Shepard's Nursing Agency serving people in 

Wheeler, Gray, Hemphill, Hutchinson, 
Collingsworth and Carson counties. Providing 
services for the homebound patient. These 
services include skilled nursing by licensed 
personnel. Home health aide for all personal 
care. 

100% Reimbursement by Medicare 
For more information contact our offices 

located in 
Pampa: 806-665-0356 

Wheeler: 806-826-3097 
Shamrock: 806.256-3984 

Ernie & Susie Wilkinson Adm. 
Mike Kirpatrick—RN 
	

Tillie Snelgrooes—LVN 
Verna Markham—LVN 
	

Bonnie Lamb—HHA 
Bobbie Shields—LVN 
	

Debbie Baird—HHA 
Doretta Moore—LVN 
	

Katie Parker—HHA 

The OMA met Thursday, Feb. 1, in 
the hospitality room of the First State 
Bank An Mobeetie at 6:00 p.m. The 
meeting was called to order by 
President, Ada Lou Lester. Louise 
Hogan led the prayer. Austin Caldwell 
read the minutes of the last meeting 
and Louise Hogan gave the treasurer 
report. There were expenses of 
$170.35; donations for memorials for 
Bernice Caldwell and Mr. Sppruell 
amounted to, $175.00. A motion was 
made by Maurita Stribling to accept 
the minutes and finance report as 
read, was seconded by Caro!.  
McCurley, the motion carried unani-
mously. 

Louise Hogan reported that the 
cookbooks that she ordered were in 
the process of being printed, she also 
had called Rex Martin about a good 
picture of, the Old Mobeetie Jail 
Museum to be used to make postcards 
and he promised to furnish a good 
picture. 

Ada Lou had contacted the highway 
department telling them we had 
received the historical marker of the 
Mobeetie Post Office that was 100 and 
10 years old in 1989 and the County 
Highway Department will erect the 
marker near the post office on the 
Farm to Market road. Sallie Harris 
reported that the caretakers, Al and 
Ruby Caviness could not be at the 
Mobeetie Museum, any longer so we 
are now in need of a retired couple to 
live in the trailer home to keep the 
museum and the surrounding grounds 
in order. The president asked Sallie 
Harris to post adds in the paper 
asking for prospective caretakers. 

There being no further business the 
meeting adjourned at 7:00 p.m. Those 
present were: Carol McCurley, Ada 
Lou Lester, Jap Bailey, Maurita 
Stribling, Austin Caldwell, Louise 
Hogan, and Sallie Harris. 

Come to our next meeting March 
1st, everyone interested in the com-
munity history and caring for and 
preserving it. 

Sallie Harris, 
Reporter 

JENNINGS PLUMBING 
& ELECTRIC SERVICE 

Owner: Larry Jennings 
" A flush is better than a full house." 

Rota-Rooter Service—Repairs—Remodeling 
Phone: 806/826-3153 	12 Years Experience 	 P.O. Box 423 
1110 South Main St. 	Reasonable Rates 	Wheeler, Tx. 79096 

FIRST 

Church 
( Weldon 

Rives, 
Pastor 

WHEELER MENU 
Feb. 12-16 

MONDAY: Breakfast; Juice, cereal, 
toast, milk. 
Lunch; BBQ Pork ribs, curly Q's, 
ranch style beans, bread, milk/tea, 
sugar cookies. 
TUESDAY: Breakfast; Juice, bis-
cuits/gravy, sausage. milk. 
Lunch; Chicken fried steak, m. pota-
toes/gravy, green beans, hot rolls, 
milk/tea, pears. 
WEDNESDAY: Breakfast; Juice, 
cinnamon rolls, milk. 
Lunch; Chili, pickles, cheese. veg. 
rings, crackers, milk/tea, peach 
cobbler. 
THURSDAY: Breakfast; Juice, hash 
browns, sausage, toast, milk. 
Lunch; Corn dogs, tater rounds, 
gelatin/fruit, milk/tea, chocolate 
cake. 
FRIDAY: Breakfast; Juice, cereal, 
toast, milk. 
Lunch; Mexican pile-on, salad, 
cheese, chips, milk/tea, pineapple. 
menu subject to change. 

1,  
2, 3, 7, 8, 9, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 

1. 	&45 & E W6' Blk 5 Allison 
ROL—Private Oil Co, Inc. to Benita 

M. Gunter et ux 1-26-90 NW/4 Sec 6 
AB&M Survey 

C/C WILL—Norris E. Root to Ex 
Parte 1-19-90 

ASORR—Laroy H. Purdy to Hub 
Hill, Inc. 1-23-90 SW/4 Sec 8 Blk A-8 

RELEASE STATE TAX 
LIEN—State of Texas to ANR Supply 
Co. 1-23-90 

ASORR—Douglass & Dietz, A Par-
tnership to William B. Douglass, Jr. 
et al 11-10-89 Sec 8 Blk RE 

MERGER—Flag-Redfern Oil Co. to 
Kerr-McGee Corp. 11-8-89 

JANUARY 30, 1990 
ASORR—Gifford Operating Co. to 

John F. Saucier 6-5-89 E/2 Sec 4 Blk 
A-4 

EXT DT—Trustee Holding Corp. to 
William D. Neary Trade Trustee 
1-25-90 

PATENT—State of Texas to E.T. 
Kegel 1-12-90 320.59 ac W/2 Sec 22 
Blk 17 

C/C PROBATE—Jacqueline L. 
Auchterlonie to Ex Parte 1-17-90 

MD—Hugh Auchterlonie III to 
South Elmwood One, Inc. 1-15-90 See 
Instrument 

MD—Charles C. Auchterlonie to 
South Elmwood One. Inc. 1-15-90 See 
Instrument 

D—Lucille Gray Reneau et al to 

WELCOME TO 

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
8TH AT MA IN - P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

18061 826-3114 • Parsonage (806) 826-3079 

Sunday School 	9:45 a.m. 

Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6:00 p.m. 



Can Benny Richard 

be 39 and holding? 

Parenting Seminar Planned By Methodist 
The First United Methodist 

Church, Wheeler, Texas is offering 
information and registration for an 
innovative video-based seminar for 
parents of pre-teen children. The 
seminar will be at the church each 

,Lesday evening from 7:30 to 9:30 
starting February 20th and 

continuing through March 27th. 
Registration cost only $15.00 per 
farni'' unit. 

Called Active Parenting, Dr. 
Michael Popkin of Atlanta, GA., is its 
founder and Director. Dr. Popkin has 
served as Child and Family specialist 
for Buckhead Mental Health Center in 

FFA 	 From Page 1 

rock, Market Barrows; Matt Morgan, 
Shamrock, Market Barrows; Casey 
Oldham, Shamrock, Market Lambs;; 
Kenneth Patton, Shamrock, Market 
Lambs, Market Barrows; Charley 
Russell, Shamrock, Market Steers, 
Market Barrows; Chris Seay, Sham-
rock, Market Lambs, Market Barrows; 
Hugh Shannon, Shamrock, Market 
Lambs, Market Barrows; Jody Stone, 
Shamrock, Market Barrows; Pike 
Vaughan, Shamrock, Market 
Barrows. 

Wheeler FFA: Christi Hill, 
Wheeler, Market Lambs; Shelly 
McCasland, Wheeler, Market Lambs. 

Briscoe FFA: Danny Nelson, 
Briscoe, Market Barrows; Dusty 
Walker, Briscoe, Market Lambs; Lacy 
Walker, Briscoe, Market Lambs. 

Allison FFA: Jerome Grayson, Alli-
son, Market Lambs; Ken Grayson, 
Allison, Market Lambs; Jarrett 
Helton, Allison, Market Lambs; 
Justin Herod, Allison, Market Lambs; 
Michael Herod, Allison, Market 
Lambs; Aaron Hollon, Allison, Market 
Lambs; Jody Powledge, Briscoe, 
Market Lambs. 

Mobeetie FFA: Destry James, 
Mobeetie, Market Barrows; Amanda 
Jo May, Mobeetie, Market Lambs, 
Market Barrows; Jackie Don May, 
Mobeetie, Market Barrows; John 
Moffett, Mobeetie, Market Barrows; 
Kelley Quarles, Mobeetie, Market 
Barrows. 
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HIGH POINT EXHIBITOR: Justin 
Herod, Allison FFA, was named the 
high point exhibitor at the Wheeler 
County Junior Livestock Show 

(Photo by The Shamrock Texan) 

Pictures Needed 
"The Wheeler Tim. s" needs 

pictures of your child or grandchild 
to run in the McCasland-Smith 
Agency advertisment. 

Here is an opportunity to show 
everybody how cute those 'kids' 
arc. There is no charge: all we need 
is a studio picture (individual 
billfold to 5x7). Please include 
child's name, age at the time the 
picture was taken. and parent's 
name and address. The child's 
grandparents can be named if the 
list is not too long. 

ft' 

bought by Wheeler Thriftw ay (Johnny 

Velasquez) and First National Bank of 
Wheeler (Van Baize) for $800. (Photo 
by The Shamrock Texan) 

COUNTY 
HOR 

K 
GRAND CHAMPION HOG: Toby 
Keys, Allison FFA, had the Grand 
Champion Hog at the Wheeler County 
Livestock Show. Toby's hog was 

GRAND CHAMPION STEER: Shonda 
Prescher, Shamrock 4-H, had the 
Grand Champion Steer at the Wheeler 
County Junior Livestock Show. 

Shonda's steer was purchased by the 
Shamrock Boosters for $1,325.00. 

(Photo by Shamrock Texan) 

Are —7Itere 4-11 	 From Page 1 
primarily professional breeders and 
ranchers. 

Entries in both the open and junior 
shows combine with horse show 
entries to make the Houston Livestock 
Show the world's largest. 

Local entrants are: Todd Baize, 
Wheeler, Comm. Steers; Nacy Davis, 
Wheeler, Market Steers, Beef Heif-
ers; Neal Ray Davis, Wheeler, Market 
Steers, Beef Heifers; Marcus Hard-
castle, Wheeler, Market Lambs; Andy 
King, Wheeler, Market Steers, 
Market Lambs; Kasey McCasland, 
Wheeler, Market Steers, Market 
Lambs; Shelly McCasland, Wheeler, 
Market Steers; Jody Powledge, 
Briscoe, Market Steers; Shonda 
Prescher, Shamrock, Market Steers; 
Sara Powledge, Briscoe, Market 
Steers; Desha Russell, Shamrock, 
Market Steen. 

RESERVE CHAMPION HOG: David 
Seymour, Shamrock 4-H, was the 
proud owner of the Reserve Grand 
Champion Hog at the Wheeler County 

Junior 
was 

Livestock Show. David's hog 
purchased by C&S Supply for 

c600.00. 

(Photo by The Shamrock Texan) 

Chat From Page 1 
Barbara and the girls had 

everything ready to load for a trip to 
Hinton and Micheal's last family 
dinner for a while if things did not go 
well. 

Monday to give moral support to the 
family of a niece who was having 
surgery. She is the daughter of Jimmy 
Goad, Sara's brother. 

San Milieu of Austin, TX. is in 
Wheeler this week taking care of 
business. He is also visiting with his 
mother, Jo Ann Taylor and his 
grandmother, Mildred Porter. San 
is trying to get arrangements made so 
that he can attend college. 

Vera Briclsey is with her daughter, 
Rosemary Polachek in Wichita Falls 
this week. Rosemary is to have some 
surgery as the result of a car accident 
a few months ago. Her injury was in 
the shoulder and ribs. 

Lavelle Stephens is taking post-
operative therapy since her hip sur-
gery. She says she'll be home when 
she can drive her car. 
Melinda, Tim and I spent Fri, night 

and Saturday with Tim's parents in 
Dumas. Saturday was Melinda's 
birthday, so there was a birthday 
dinner with the family which included 
Larry and Debbie Whorton and Ray, 
Tim's brother. His sister was missing 
as she, with husband and family are • 
now living in Indionesia. 

-ewe- 
Monday was travel time again; we 

had to be in Hinton to go to court at 
3:30 in Oklahoma City, if necessary. 
Patricia and Jane accompanied us; we 
had promised Jane a new dining 
experience—"Johnny's" hamburgers 
and coneys. Since we did not have to 
go to court, we made a special trip to 
El Reno. The food was just as good as 
we promised, but we didn't have 
much elbow room. The next food was 
served in a cup and dishes at Clinton. 

-ewe- 
The next step in Michael's situation 

will be to continue to try for custody. 
-ewe- 

to; 

Atlanta, and Child, Adolescent and 
Family Coordinator for Northside 
Community Mental Health Center. 
also in Atlanta. 

According to Dr. Popkin. "Disci-
plining a child or teen occurs within 
the context of relationship. If that 
relationship is good, the discipline 
works; if the relationship is not good, 
the discipline simply produces addi-
tional conflict." Active Parenting 
provides a step-by-step technique for 
achieving growth in the family rela-
tionship, for all members, regardless 
of the discord already there. 

By utilizing the video format, Active 
Parenting can provide a visual scene 
which elicits an experimental reaction 
to past occurrences in the home. Then 
the peer group of participants dis-
cusses its methods for dealing with 
similar situations at home and review 
negative and positive methods for 
obtaining results with their child-
ren. 

Under the direction of a "guide" 
who is familiar with the Active 
Parenting method, the group expands 
the possibilities available to them in 
their parenting roles and leaves each 
session equipped to make a change in 
their responses to their children. 

During the six-week period, 
methods for the development of 
mutual respect, cooperation and self-
esteem of all members of the family 
group are offered and practiced. It's 
as easy as Show and Tell because of 
the evolving video segments and 
simple question-and-answer hand-
book. The support group of peers 
provides an ideal environment for 
discussion. 

Dr. Poplin stresses that Active 
Parenting is not psychotherapy but 
rather a review of basics that every 
parent already knows. There is no 
dwelling on who did what and why, 
but rather a positive move-ahead 
promise that it's never too late to 
evolve change. 

Familiar scenes in the video part of 
the program include the age-old 
scenario of "I don't want to" and 
"It's your fault" and "If you don't 
pick up your toys, 	The 
Handbook chapters include headings 
such as Keeping the Lines Open; 
Avoiding Communication Blocks; 
Freedom and the Limits to Freedom; 
Parenting and Anger; the ABC's of 
Behavior. Charts, dialogue and ques-
tion-and-answer sheets move the par-
ticipants forward in a thoughtful, 
educated manner; the video brings 
out the reflex, "That's our family, all 
right," while the discussion elicits 
support, just knowing there are others 
who are experiencing similar dil-
emmas. 

Active Parenting purpose is 
"To support the development ot 
human potential by providing parents 
with sufficient information and skills 
to prepare children who will develop 
the qualities necessary for thriving in 
a democratic society: courage, re-
sponsibility, and cooperation." 

The First United Methodist Church 
proposes to add faith to those qualities 
that in Christian discipleship we may 
more fully understand parenting in 
the context of the Scriptures for the 
most effective daily living. 

Active Parenting is endorsed by the 
National Organization Advisory 
Council for Children. 

For additional information call or 
write The First United Methodist 
Church at P.O. Box 89, Wheeler, 
Texas 79096; 806-826-3114. 

(Photo by The Shamrock Texan) 

LIBRARY NEWS 

Fire Science lasses 
Presented Fire Dept. 

SHOWMANSHIP AWARDS: The 
above three Wheeler County youths 
were presented with Showmanship 
Silver Trays for their performances in 
the Wheeler County Junior Livestock 
Show. Pictured (1. to r.) are Andy 
King, steers; Justin Herod, swine; 
and Amanda Rives, sheep. 

TEMI DUNN 
COORDINATOR FOR ST. JUDE 

CHILDREN'S RESEARCH 
HOSPITAL 

St. Jude Children's Research 
Hospital announced today that Temi 
Dunn will coordinate the St. Jude 
Children's Research Hospital 
"Wheels For Life" Bike-A-Thon in 
Wheeler on May 19, 1990. 

Founded by Danny Thomas in 1962, 
S Jude Children's Hospital is the 
largest childhood cancer research-
treatment-education center in 
America. St. Jude Hospital is non-sec-
tarian, interracial and provides 
medical care for over 3,200 active 
patients. Currently, over $183,000 is 
needed each day to keep the doors 
open. These funds come primarily 
from public contributions. 

By Laura Guthrie 
Have you noticed the color change 

we have taken on recently? I notice it 
on the TV screen because that's about 
the only chance I have to see people. 
I'm talking about the color change in 
men's neckties. Not so long ago about 
90% of men's ties were red. Then I 
noticed a few of the conspicious 
characters like Brian Gumble, Peter 
Jennings, etc. wearing black and gray 
with their gray and black suits. The 
change certainly caught on fast. Now 
nearly every man has a dark tie. There 
are some mixed colors in stripes, 
paislies, polka dot, and "finger paint-
ed". Ocassionally there's a figured 
teal blue or purple. I like them very 
much, although I have no objections to 
red ties. And, at the price of present 
day ties a man does well to have a 
change. 

I hear by grapevine that Mike and 
Tina Lee, and family have bought a 
house and moved into town. They 
have for several years lived on the 
Lee's ranch near Mobeetie. Tina 
drove in for her work at the Beauty 
Salon. Now, Mike does the driving to 
the ranch. 

Dorothy and Adrian visited with 
their children and grandchildren in 
Okla. City last week. Darla and Punk 
Childress were making another trip to 
Longview, to locate a house they can 
move into. Their children, Wade and 
Kari, have jobs in Okla. City, so they 
will continue to live there. 

I saw Jimmy Hill at the grocery 
store last week. He was assisted in his 
buying by a very attractive little 
granddaughter. Shed was Jim's 
daughter's (Melissa) child. She had 
been visiting with the Jimmy Hills and 
the great grandmother, Esther Hill for 
several days. 

Sara Pond and Ida Mae Goad flew 
(from Amarillo) to Albuquerque 

We are continuing to get new 
books often. Some of the new books 
are: 
Rama II by Arthur C. Clarke 
Only The Lonely by Roy Orbison 
Harmful Intent by Robin Cook 
Spy Line by Len Deighton 
Bride by Julie Garwood 
Lion's Lady by Julie Garwood 
Cold Harbour by Jack Higgins 
Ruling Passion by Judith Michael 
Father of Love by Janette Oke 
Love Finds a Home by Janette Oke 

Legal Notice 
Local invitation to Bid 
On Pavement Marking 

Sealed proposals for three separate 
pavement marking contracts located 
in Briscoe, Childress, Collingsworth, 
Cottle, Dickens, Donley, Foard, Hall, 
Hardeman, King, Knox, Motley, and 
Wheeler counties will be received at 
the State Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation District 
office at 1700 Ave. F, NW, Childress, 
Texas 79201, until 10:00 A.M. on 
February 26, 1990. 

A pre-bid conference will be held 
with Mr. Vance L. Castleberry, PE, 
District Engineer, at the District 
Office in Childress, Texas at 10:00 
A.M., February 16, 1990. Persons 
interested in bidding on the above 
contracts should attend the pre bid 
conference. 

The State Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation, in accor-
dance with the provisions of Title VI of 
the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat. 
Z52) and the regulations of the U.S. 
Department 	of Transportation 
(15C.F.R., Part 8), issued pursuant 10 
such act, hereby notifies all bidders 
that it will affirmatively insure that 
the contract entered into pursuant to 
this advertisement will be awarded to 
the lowest responsible bidder without 
discrimination on the ground of race, 
color, or national origin. 

U.S. CENSUS BUREAU NEEDS 
APPLICANTS 

Kathryn Paul with the U.S. 
Census Bureau will be testing pro-
spective applicants for jobs with the 
1990 Census at City Hall Community 
Room at 1:00 p.m. on Thursday. Feb. 
15. 

T.A. HENNARD AWARD: Shelly 
McCasland of Wheeler was this year's 
recipient of the T.A. Hennard, Jr. 
Citizenship Award. The award was 
presented to Shelly before the 
Wheeler County Junior Livestock 
Show's Sale. 

(Photo by The Shamrock Texan) 

We Love You, 
Morn & Mr. Dad 

well-known Aitus piano teacher who 
died last year. The daughters of Gwen 
and Steven Emmert are shown at the 
nine foot $65,000 Bosendorfer grand 
they played last October when they 
%1 on fourth trophy in the duet competi-
tion sponsored by SOW in Weather-
ford. 

JORDAN AND KARA EMMERT 
TO PLAY IN COMPETITION 
Jordan and Kara Emmert are two 

of ten Ben Karnes students who will 
play in the Juanita Hubbard Invita-
tional Piano Competition at South-
western State University in Weather-
ford Saturday, Feb. 10. The event is 
named in honor of Juanita Hubbard. 

The pyramids ot tgypt contain enough stone and mortar to construct a 
wall ten feet high and five feet wide running from New York City to Los 
Angeles 

Dan Stewart, Wheeler High School 
Science Teacher, presented a twelve 
hour intermediate level Fire Science 
class for the Volunteer Firefighters of 
Wheeler County and surrounding area 
on January 22th thru the 25th. This 
class was presented at Wheeler High 
School. This class enables local fire-
fighters to better understand and 
predict results of various chemical 
reactions encountered in structure 
fires. A second week (twelve hours) of 
Fire Science will be presented March 
19th thru 22nd. The members of the 
Wheeler Volunteer Fire Department 
extend our sincere thanks to Dan for 
his time and effort involved in these 
two classes. Those members attend-
ing this class were: From Wheeler 
Vol. Fire Dept.; Boyd Austin, Walter 
Simmons. Ron Thornton, Dan 
Kenney, Max McQueen, Robert Ford, 
H.L. Owens, Gary Davis, Ken 
Daughtry, Charles Ellison, Riley 
Atwood, Russell Gaines, Jackie 
Sparlin, Michael Kenney. From 
Lefors Vol. Fire Dept.: Liz Atchley, 
Lanny Atchley, Rick Callaway. 

All area firefighters are welcome to 
attend any training classes sponsored 
by the Wheeler Volunteer Fire Dept. 
Classes are held on the first, third and 
Fifth Thursday of each month at 7:00 
p.m. All classes are accredited toward 
the State Fireman's and Fire Mar-
shal's Association Certification pro-
gram for Volunteer Firefighters. 



HAPPY BIRTHDAY 
(Founded February 8, 1910) 

BOY SCOUTS 
OF AMERICA 

Boy Scouts of America was 
founded in 1910. Scouts has grown 
into the largest boy's club in the 
world. 

This organization not only has 
kept our boys occupied in their 
younger years, but is has given 
them a sense of right and wrong; a 
reason to be free and to grow—not 
only in their bodies, but in their 
minds and hearts. 

Wheeler Boy Scout Troop 472 
has twenty-nine scouts and four 
new recruits. The largest group for 
Wheeler. 

Each year the Boy Scouts has a 
food drive. The food collected stays 
in Wheeler. The past year food was 
delivered to over thirty families. 
The food drive this year is 
scheduled for the last week in 

February and the first week of 
March. 

The local scouts will be selling 
popcorn to help raise money for 
uniforms. 

Activites scheduled for 1990 will 
be: attending all M. K. Brown 
activities, two camping trips, 
family cookout, swimming party, 
fathers and sons fishing day, 
mothers and sons fun in the sun 
day and all the Boy Scout com-
petition available to the local boys. 

If finances allow, the troop plans 
a one day trip to "White Water" in 
Oklahoma City. 

Members of the Wheeler troop 
are Tommy Abell, Daniel Argan-
bright, Danny Alley, Wade 
Brickey, Corey Case, Dusty Case, 
Andy Copeland, Britton Davis, 

We Support Our Local Boy Scouts . . . 

Darby Dorman, Charlie Flanagan, 
Andy Francis, Mike Hibler, Jeremy 
Kenney, Jimmie Lewallen, Ryan 
McNeil, Rocky Mendiola, Kris 
Rarden, Damon Remy, Robert 
Remy, T. A. Taylor, Trent Ware, 
Philip Wiggins, John Wolf, Heath 
Sabbe, Justin Hefley, Ashly 
Brownfield, Dean Hutchison, 
Johnny Porter, Robert Stiles, 
Jarred Ledbetter, Chad Reeves, 
Keith Rose and Lewis Remos. 

Scout Master Avis Miller is 
assisted by Jim Lewallen, Lee 
Hibler and Bill Wiggins, Jr. 

The Boy Scouts have a window 
display set up at Flowers 'N 
Things. You are invited to stop by 
and see the display. 

Help support the Boy Scouts. 

Andie's — Kent and Andrea 
Angelique, Gayla, Stacy, Anissa, Katja 

Van, Renee', Todd & Vanessa Baize 

Dave, Mary, Benjamin, Jacob & Joshua Britt 

David & Paula Britt 

Sandra Christner 

Claudine's Beauty Shop 

Cross Car Center 
David & Kathleen Cross 

Dick & Jean DeArment 

First National Bank in Wheeler 

Joe, Carolyn, Kelli & Heath Sabbe 

Frankenbery Texaco 
Bob & Valetta 

Leonard, Sandy & Samantha Gaines 

Gary's Kerr McGee Station 

H. & R. Block 

Hibler Implement Company 
Lee, Pam, Michael & Joannie 

Hyland's Pharmacy 

Johnny's Shamrock Service 
Johnny, Betty, Melissa & Justin Chapman 

The Kinnards 
Henry, Phyllis, Tonya, Jay & Monty 

Charles Kuntz, CPA 

L. & F. Repair 

Lee Hardware & Furniture 

Maxey's Steakhouse 

McCasland-Smith Agency 

Mcllhany Dry Goods 

Pierce's Trading Post 

Production Credit Association 

Adrian & Dorothy Risner 

AmWest 

The Shear Delight 
Melody, Debbie, Tina 

Leo & Sylvia Shuler 

M. Kent Sims, Attorney at Law 

Sparlin's Restaurant 

Speedi-Mart 

Bill & Nema Stewart 

Arvid, Joetta, Bob, Benny & Mark Sword 

The Smith Agency 

Three-H Cattle Company 

Thriftway of Wheeler 

Vise Energy 

Ware Chevrolet-Buick-Oldsmobile-Pontiac 

Wheeler Flower Shop 

Wheeler Lumber Company 

Wheeler Redi-Mix 
R.J. & Georgia Smith 

Wheeler Vet Clinic 

Max & Ruth Wiley 

Bob & Evangeline Wills 

Wright Funeral Home 

Avis Miller, Jeff & Charlie 
Steve Emmert, Atty. 

Dr. Mike Smith 

The Wheeler Times 
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To the Editor 
The Wheeler Times 

manner. Then, when trouble comes, 
we often find that "there is no 
justice", regardless of the constitu-
tions which "guarantee" it. 

What could be a greater motivation 
to scorn justice and ignor the law? 

Lt. Col. IRed'd] John C. Love 
United State Marine Crops 

Wheeler Senior Citizens 

February Meeting 

4r 

MR. AND MRS. PAUL THOMAS KUEHN 

WALKER-KUEHN VOWS ARE 
EXCHANGED IN NEW MEXICO 

The Wheeler Senior Citizens 
gathered night, Feb. 5th for their 
monthly dinner and game night with 
24 members and 1 guest attending. 
Claudy Brotherton led the group in 
singing 'Happy Birthday' to Tom 
Helton, Jack Hays, J.D. Beaty, and 
Roy Meadows. Myrtle Davidson 
baked the birthday cake. Claudy 
Brotherton gave the blessing. 

The Valentine theme was beauti-
fully carried out in the table 
decorations. 

Those enjoying the meal were B.K. 
Barham, Jack and Doris Hays, J.D. 
and Florine Beaty, Eli and Helen 
Sabbe, Opal Davidson, Jewel Hollo-
man, Jean Pollock, Elva Wood, 
Fannie Mae Bradstreet, Mary Fin-
sterwald, Hestell Killingsworth, 
Claudy and Ina Mae Brotherton, Roy 
and Lois Meadows, Tom and Alice 
Bell Helton, Mary Hudson, Nellie 
Horton, 	Loyd 	Davidson, 
Birdie Hudson and Novella Vanpool. 

Helen Sabbe presided at the 
business meeting, Elva Wood read 
the minutes and gave the treasurers 
report. Officers elected for another 
year are President, Helen Sabbe; 
Vice-President, Deris Hays; Secretary 
- Treasurer, Elva Wood; Reporter, 
Lois Meadows, Program Chairman, 
Amelia Sims, Decorating Chairmen, 
lone May and Novella Vanpool. 

Names drawn for door prizes were 
Mary Hudson and Claudy Brotherton. 

Games of 88 and dominoes were 
enjoyed. 

When Justice Fails 
Dear Editor: 

The tragic lead story in today's 
(Jan. 18, 90) Oklahoman is but 
another example of the demoralizing 
effect of failed justice upon ordinary 
citizens. The story of a Hinton man 
charged by the FBI in Maryland with 
the kidnapping of his 5-year-old son 
must certainly tug the heart-strings of 
every parent or grandparent... not to 
mention the effect of this sad and 
unfortunate incident upon the 
youngster himself. 

The story relates how the boy's 
28-year-old father, after many fruit-
less attempts to have his day in court, 
concerning the boy's health and 
welfare, is thwarted in these attempts 
by a ruling from the State Supreme 
Court (two days before the trial) which 
prevented a jury trial of his complaint 
of neglect by the mother, and granting 
(without trial) to the out-of-
state mother. The Oklahoma Supreme 
Court justified its verdict upon a 
technicality, a state law which 
requires that a juvenile can be held in 
temporary state custody no more than 
90 days before such a trial. Another 
curious circumstance was that the 
mother, who lives in Maryland, had 
been represented by a Maryland 
Deputy State Attorney, acting as a 
private attorney in custody hearings in 
that state. Did the Oklahoma Supreme 
Court consider this obvious miscar-
riage of justice in the determination of 
its verdict? 

What does one do when one cannot 
obtain EVEN the constitutionally 
guaranteed justice of his day in court? 
What this young man did was to hide 
with, and care for his child for more 
than two years. What would you have 
done? Does this make him the kind of 
criminal who deserves up to five years 
in the penitentiary? The courts 
apparently think so! 

It is difficult to believe that the 
Oklahoma Supreme Court could not 
have made their ruling before the 
90-day deadline...or found a way to 
extend that time so that Justice could 
be served and the family's ordeal 
solved in a manner more fair and 
considerate of their (and the boys) 
unfortunate positions. 

We "laymen" go through life with 
assuring confidence that if we ever get 
into trouble, the courts will settle the 
matter in a fair, considerate and just 

Wheeler Extension 

Homemakers Club 

another in the Meridian community. 
Irene Burckhalter called me to tell 

me of the death of her cousin Roy 
"Cotton" Gamble. Services were in 
Quarterlane, Ore. He died of a heart 
attack Sunday. Cotton was raised 
around here and was a good musician. 
He and Joe used to play together a lot. 

We saw Lorene Bryan and Patricia 
Sargent in Erick. They were visiting 
the Otto Atkinson. Joyce and her 
husband have been here a few weeks. 
She is in the Armed Forces and 
stationed in Germany. 

Lucille Barker and I admired the 
four tomatoes for $2.39 but agreed • 
they were too rich for our blood. 
Geraldine Bruner said they were 
doing fine. Had seen Opal Nabors last 
week. 

Joe visited with Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Kindsfather and Bud Walker. 

I am always thankful to see the first 
of February come and the hunting 
season end. Guess the poor wildlife, 
livestock, and insulators are glad too. 
No hunting til the turkeys nest and 
have to be shot at. I've never figured 
out why they let them hunt turkeys 
during the nesting season. Very few 
hunt for food, only for the thrill of 
killing a living creature. 

Sue Atchley, Pres., reports the 
January Sweetwater PTA meeting 
was well attended. They now have 
over SO members. Next meeting will 
be February 13 in the lunchroom at 
seven. Everyone come. On the recent 
program were Lisa Tucker, Misty 
Keathley, Nelda Tucker, Phil 
Williams, Brenda Quinn, and Char-
lene Carey. 

Thought that was really something -
to keep a plane on hold till it ran out of 
gas and crashed. Seems they told the 
airport officials they needed priority to 
land as they.were very low on fuel, but 
they didn't mention the magic word 
emergency so they didn't get to land. 

Nice piece in the Oklahoman about 
Jody Miller of Blanchard. Seems she 
finally made an album titled My 
Country that President Bush heard. 
He then invited her to sing at his 
inauguration ball. We met her once 
long ago when Joe's folks lived at 
Blanchard. She was singing at the 
Nursing Home. 

President Bush made a nice speech 
but he forgot all our problems at 
home. Over a third million babies are 
born each year already drug addicts. 
Every day more plants simply close or 
move out to a country with cheap 
labor. And each time, thousands of. 
jobs are lost. You can't hardly buy 
anything made in the USA anymore. 
No use asking Ronnie for his diaries. 
He surely was smart enough to burn 
them or have 011ie shred them while 
he was in the business. 

They say a third of Americans can't 
read or write. I read an article that in 
forty years no one would be alive. I 
think there will be a few but they may 
be living under trees or in caves with a 
campfire to cook on. Between spaced 
out drug addicts, Aids, and illiterates, 
there will be no one able enough to 
keep things going. As Paul Harvey 
says. we'll all be zombies. 

Co. Commissioners 

Attend Conference 

Groundhog day and he sure 
didn't see his shadow today. But 
regard!ess of signs, we all know there 
will be some more winter before the 
middle of May. We gathered our-
selves together and went to town for a 
supply of getalongs before the 
promised snow storm comes thru. it 
was cold and foggy. The highway men 
were out putting sand on the bridges. 

Leiskin Fredrichson and Esther 
Dickey had the same idea. Were 
rushing around to get home before the 
weather got worse. Visited with Helen 
Howell. Said Hobart was still making 
music and had plowed the garden 
twice already. 

Ola and C.B. Crook were honored 
on their 40th anniversary with a 
reception at the fellowship hall of the 
Erick Baptist Church last Sunday. 
They were very happy to have all their 
children there - Dale, Danny and 
Teresa, and Doug of Amarillo, Billy 
and Mary of Pampa. Also the six 
grandchildren - Jeremy Kyle. Chris, 
Morgan, Shelby, and Brenda. 
Another highlight was that C.B.'s 
aunt and uncle, Virgie and Con Kahoa 
were able to attend. The Crook sons 
put on a skit Mission Impossible. The 
rest of the afternoon was spent 
visiting and taking pictures. I was 
flattered that Teresa called me long 
distance from Amarillo to tell about 
the party. Congratulations C.B. and 
Ola. 

And congratulations to Stella and 
Orville Matlock. He told me they 
celebrated their fiftieth anniversary 
recently in Amarillo with their sons, 
Dale and Harold and their families. 
Stella's sister, Vonnie Reed, and 
Orville's brother and wife Roy and 
Kathryn Matlock. 

Little John Pat Brady spent a couple 
of days in the Sayre hospital. Elmer 
and Alma Griffin have been ill and 
spent a week at Perryton with Helen 
and Kenneth Allen, their kids. 

Well, the killer bees are expected to 
reach Texas this spring. The Texans 
are trying to figure out what to do. 
They travel about 300 miles a year. 
Oklahoma can expect them in a year 
or two. 

The Fabulous Strings and Things -
The erick Kitchen Band journeyed to 
the Care Center at Wheeler Tuesday 
to entertain their Texican friends. Had 
a wonderful time. Visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward Killingsworth, Mae 
Welch of Briscoe and Barbara 
Newsom for a few. Managed to cash 
my last gift certificate. Band members 
were Billy and Basil Doss from 
Carnegie, Jack and Donna Mercer, 
Bertha Coffey, Jack Criswell, Betty 
Brothers, Roy Swagger, Richard 
Crawford, Iona Miller, Rosa Faye 
Abla, Virgie and Alvin Marshall, and 
we three. Virgie and Iona were having 
birthdays so they were serenaded. 
Hazel Francis was ill and missed the 
fun. 

Our Volunteer Fireman have been 
busy lately. We saw a big grass fire 
near the Nine Mile store. Thought it 
might be on the Britt Ranch. Then 
there was one over by Bulo and 

A representative of the Tralee Crisis 
Center will be in the City Office 
Meeting room in Wheeler the 2nd and 
4th Wed. each month at 2:30 to 4:30 

P.M. For more information 1-800-828-
2891. 

A fluffy snowfall and the lovely 
historic Loretto Chapel in Santa Fe, 
New Mexico, was the background for 
the December 30th, 1989, exchange of 
wedding vows by Miss Tracy Renee 
Walker and Mr. Paul Thomas Kuehn, 
both of Tallahassee, Florida. 

Officiating at the double ring cere-
mony was the Rev. Lars Hamerson, 
retired minister of the Presbyterian 
church who had also officiated at the 
bride's parents wedding twenty-seven 

years prior. 
Mr. Mike Koussiafes, of Tallahas-

see, Florida, served his friends as 
Best Man while Miss Tara Benet' 
Younger of Austin. Texas former 
college roommate, served as Maid of 
Honor. Miss Tara Ann Walker of 
Santa Fe, New Mexico, niece of the 
bride, was flower girl. Both atten-
dants were attired in gowns fashioned 
of wine colored moire taffeta. The 
flower girl carried a hand crocheted 
basket made by the bride's great 
great grandmother that has been used 
in all family weddings for over 30 
years. 

Given in marriage by her father, the 
bride formal length gown of Jacquard 
Satin, accented with lace, seed pearls 
and sequins on the bodice and a 
sweep train. In order to carry out the 
wedding traditions, she carried a 
white lace hankerchief that had be-
longed to her maternal great great 
grandmother; "Something New" was 
her wedding ring which was fashioned 
using the diamond from her paternal 

By Wanda King 
Donna Moore hosted the Wheeler 

County Extension Homemakers Club 
meeting on January 25, 1990 at Olney 
Savings. 

The evenings program was given by 
Marie Wright entitled "Leadership/ 
International Understanding Where 
In the World Are You?" Mrs. Wright 
brought out many interesting bits of 
information and lead the group in a 
good discussion on world affairs. 

During the course of the meeting 
the Roll Call question was_ what we 
like best about our community. Com-
ments were really favorable and it was 
the concensus of the group that 
Wheeler was blessed with paved 
streets, clean city and friendly people 	V,' 
as well as short lines. You can't get 
much better than that. 

Club members are reminded to 
bring spools of thread to be donated to 
the Wheeler Care Center mending 
center. 

The next meeting will be held on 
February 8th at Olney Savings. 
Evelyn Meek will be the guest 
speaker. Her program is entitled 
"The Situation - the Solution (coor-
dinating your personal papers)." 

Anyone interested in coming to our 
club is welcome. 

Extension Homemakers Clubs are 
open to people of all ages regardless 
of socio-economic level, race, color, 
sex, religion, handicaps or national 
origin. 

grandmother, Inis Russell Walker's 
wedding ring; "Something Borrow-
ed" was a pearl bracklet belonging to 
the Maid of Honor and "Something 
Blue" was her garter. 

Selections prior to the ceremony 
and the Wedding March were played 
by Ariana Celine of Santa Fe on the 
harp. Guests were registered by Miss 
Kristina Lasser of Sarasota, Florida, 
sister of the groom and serving as 
usher was Mr. Jack Walker of Santa 
Fe, brother of the bride. 

After the ceremony the wedding 
party and guests were ushered to the 
ballroom of the Inn at Loretto which 
was decorated in the bride's chosen 
colors and were treated to a formal 
dinner. Following dinner the lovely 
three-tiered wedding cake which was 
decorated with fresh flowers was cut 
and served by Miss Paula Trietsch, of 
Arlington, Texas and champaign 
toasts were offered by Mike Koussia-
fes, Mr. Kuehn, Mr. Walker and Rev. 
Hamerson. 

Out of town guests included Mrs. 
Mary Lasser and Kristina of Sarasota, 
Florida, Mike Koussiafes of Tallahas-
see, Fla.', Mr. and Mrs. Bernd Kuehn 
of Renton, Wash., Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarence Kuehn of Lawton, OK., 
grandparents of the groom, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Kiser, grandparents of the 
bride and Mrs. Elaine Stovall and 
Melanie of Canyon, TX., Mrs. Sue 
James and Skeat of Kerrick, TX., Mr. 
and Mrs. Ken Davis of McLean, TX., 
Tara Benet Younger of Austin, TX., 
and Miss Paula Trietsch of Arlington, 
TX. and several treasured friends 
from Santa Fe. 

The groom is the son of Mrs. Mary 
Lasser of Sarasota, Ha. and Mr. 
Bernd Kuehn of Renton, Wash., and 
the bride is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank D. Walker of Santa Fe, 
N.M. and the granddaughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank D. Walker of Wheel-
er. She is a graduate of Wheeler 
Public Schools and Southwestern Uni-
versity of Georgetown, Texas. 

For a wedding trip the couple flew 
to Tempe, Az. New Year's Day and 
attended the Fiesta Bowl game 
between Florida State and Nebraska. 
They have returned to Tallahassee 
where they are both students at 
Florida State University where Mr. 
Kuehn is seeking a degree in Aero-
nautical Engineering and Mrs. Kuehn 
a Master's in Business Administra-
tion. They will reside at 947 Alachua 
Ave. in Tallahassee, Fla. 

Legal Notice 
[From Page 4] 

78.75/158.75 mineral 
acres located in W/2 SE/4 
SE/4 SE/4; N/2 SE/4; 
SW/4 SE/4; N/2 SE/4 
SE/4; SW/4 SE/4 SE/4; 
W/2 NE/4 SE/4 SE/4 SE/4; 
and SE/4 SE/4 SE/4 SE/4 
Section 25, T 8N, R 12W, 
1.M., Caddo County, 
Oklahoma 

tion 22, Township 7 South, 
Range 16 East, lying and 
being South of the center of 
Boggy River, same being 
the approximate South 1/2  of 
NW 1/4  of NW % of Section 
22, 	containing 	ap- 
proximately 20 acres; 

TRACT IV (b): 
All that part and portion 

of the NW 'A of NW 1/4  of 
NE 'A and the N 1/2  of NE % 
of NW '/4 of Section 22, 
Township 7 South, Range 16 
East, lying and being South 
of the centerline of Boggy 
River, same being ap-
proximately 1/2  of said 30 
acre tract, or 15 acres; 

Range 16 East; thence due 
South 660 feet; thence North 
63 degrees 26' East 1476 
feet; thence North 45 
degrees 0' East 933 feet to 
the Section line between 
said Sections 22 and 27; 
thence West along said Sec-
tion line 660 feet; thence 
South 660 feet; thence West 
1,320 feet to the point of 
beginning in Section 27, 
containing 15 acres, accor-
ding to the recorded survey 
thereof; Re: Tract A: 

The SW % of SW -'% of 
Section 21, and the NE' of 
NW % of Section 28, con-
taining 80 acres, according 
to the official survey 
thereof: 

TRACT VI (c): 
The North 20 acres of Lot 

2, of Section 27, containing 
20 acres, according to the of-
ficial survey thereof; 

TRACT VII (a): 
Lots 1, 2 and 3 of Section 

23, containing 59.88 acres, 
according to the official 
survey thereof; 

TRACT I: 
The SW % of SE % of 

Section 21, and the N 1/2  of 
NE 1/4  of Section 28, con-
taining 120 acres, according 
to the official survey 
thereof: 

TRACT II: 
The E 1/2  of SE % of Sec-

tion 21, and the S 1/2  of SW 
1/4  and the S 1/2  of NW % of 
SW % of Section 22, con-
taining 180 acres, according 
to the official survey 
thereof; 

TRACT III: 
The S 1/2  of NW '/4 and the 

S'/: of NE 1/4  of NW % and 
the N 1/2  of NW % of SW 1/4  
and the NE 1/4  of SW '/4 and 
the SW 1/4  of NW % of NE 
% and the N 1/2  of SW % of 
NE % and the SW 1/4  of SW 
'A of NE 'A and the SW Ten 
Acres of Lot I, (otherwise 
being designated as the SW 
1/4  of NE '4 of NE 'A) of Sec-
tion 22. containing 220 
acres. according to the of-
ficial survey thereof; 

KELTON SCHOOL MENU 
Feb. 12-16 

MONDAY: Breakfast; Cereal, toast, 
juice, milk. 
Lunch; Polish sausage, macaroni & 
cheese, blackeyed peas, cornbread, 
applesauce, milk. 
TUESDAY: Breakfast; Rice, toast, 
juice, milk. 
Lunch; Pizza, corn, salad, gelatin 
w/fruit, milk. 
WEDNESDAY: Breakfast; Biscuits & 
gravy, juice, milk. 
Lunch; Roast, cream potatoes, gravy, 
green beans, hot rolls, peaches, milk. 
THURSDAY: Breakfast; Bacon & 
eggs, sausage & biscuits, toast & 
jelly, juice, milk. 
Lunch; Hamburgers, lettuce & toma-
toes, pickles & onions, French fries, 
ice cream, milk. 
Friday: Breakfast; Sweet rolls, juice, 
milk. 
Lunch; Sloppy Joes, baked beans, 
fried zucchini, brownies,- milk. 

TRACT VII (b): 
The East 19.70 acres of 

Lot 1 of Section 29, con-
taining 19.70 acres, accor-
ding to the official survey 
thereof; 

tion Corner of Sections 22 
and 27, Township 7 South, 
Range 16 East; thence South 
89 degrees 55' West, 10 
chains; thence into Section 
27, South 44 degrees 57' 
West, 14.15 chains; thence 
South 63 degrees 22' West 
20.79 chains to 1951 mean-
der corner; thence down 
stream along the left bank 
with the meanders of the 
river; thence South 56 
degrees 35' East, 3.41 
chains, intersecting 1897 
meander line; thence South 
67 degrees 09' East 2.29 
chains; thence North 83 
degrees 53' East, 7.63 
chains; thence North 78 
degrees 13' East, 5.73 
chains; thence North 62 
degrees 36' East, 9.38 
chains; thence North 85 
degrees 15' East, 4.11 
chains; thence North 66 
degrees 51' East, 9.32 
chains; thence North 83 
degrees 6' East, 5.53 chain-
s; thence South 86 degrees 
45' East, 6.95 chains; thence 
North 83 degrees 18' East, 
8.20 chains; thence North 8 
degrees 52' West, 21.60 
chains; thence North 19 
degrees 5' West, 11.42 
chains; thence North 27 
degrees 45' West, 6.07 
chains to the 1951 meander 
corner; thence South 33 
degrees 41' East, 20.33 
chains, intersecting North 
and South centerline of Sec-
tion 22, thence South 0 
degrees 1' East, 10 chains 
to point of beginning, con-
taining 96.04 acres, accor-
ding to the official survey 
thereof. 

TRACT VIII: 
The E V2 of SE 1/4  of NW 

'A and Lots 1, 2, 3 and 4 of 
Section 28, containing 
167.72 acres, according to 
the official survey thereof. 

TRACT V: 
Beginning at the corner of 

Sections 14, 15, 22 and 23, 
Township 7 South, Range 16 
East; thence West 1,320 feet 
along the Section line bet-
ween Sections 15 and 22; 
thence due South 660 feet; 
thence due East 660 feet; 
thence due South 660 feet; 
thence due West 660 feet; 
thence due South 660 feet; 
thence due West 660 feet; 
thence due South 660 feet; 
thence due West 660 feet; 
thence due South 1,980 feet 
to a point 660 feet due North 
of the quarter corner bet-
ween Section 22 and 27, 
Township 7 South, Range 16 
East; thence North 33 
degrees 41' East 2,379 feet; 
thence North 39 degrees 45' 
East 2,060 feet to a point on 
the Section line between 
Section 22 and 23; thence 
due North on said Section 
line 1,056 feet to the place of 
beginning, containing 87.75 
acres, according to the of-
ficial survey thereof; 

The Renaissance painter Raphael 
painted more than 300 pictures of 
the Madonna 

TRACT IV (a): 

TRACT IX: 
All that part of the NE % 

of NW % of NE 1/4  of Section 
22. Township 7 South, 
Range 16 East, lying South 
of the center line of Boggy 
River, estimated to contain 
approximately 5 acres. 

All in Choctaw County, 
Oklahoma, and all in Town-
ship 7 South, Range 16 East. 

r- 
Listen to . . . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
wheeler. "'nal,. 

[hat part and portion of 

About 800 county officials from 
across Texas took part in the 32nd 
annual statewide conference of the 
County Judges and Commissioners 
Association of Texas at the College 
Station Hilton, Jan. 23-25. 

The conference included discuss-
ions on issues such as ethics and 
elected officials, redistricting, crimi-
nal justice reform, disaster and risk 
management for counties, county and 
special district laws and addresses by 
several state officials. 

County Commissioner Bill Atherton 
of Wheeler, Co. Prect. 2 said high-
lights of the conference were County 
Purchasing Laws "Proper and Legal 
Purchasing Procedures" given by 
the Honorable Jerry Benedict, Assis-
tant Attorney General, "Risk Man-
agement and Tort Liability", Ethics 
and the Elected Official", and "The 
New Criminal Justice Reform Law". 

Yoakum County Judge Jim Barron 
of Plains, the association president, 
opened the meeting. 

John Gilmartin, county officials 
program specialists with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, said 
county commissioners who took part 
in all- general sessions earned 12.0 
continuing education units from the 
Office of Continuing Education at 
Texas A&M University. Commission-
ers who attended all conference 
sessions could apply the credit hours 
toward their mandatory 16-hour 
annual educational requirement. 

The 71st Legislature enacted I-IB 
1555, a mandatory minimum contin-
uing education requirement for county 
commissioners, beginning Jan. 1, 
1990, Gilmartin explained. 

The educational course work was 
coordinated by the V.G. Young Insti-
tute of County Government, a part of 
the Extension Service. 

Other officers besides the president 
include Gus Mutscher of Brenham, 
washington County Judge, first vice 
president; Lee Walker of Denton, 
commissioner in Denton County, 
second vice president; and Douglas H. 
Smith of Gatesville, Coryell County 
Judge, immediate past president. 

Commissioners from Wheeler 
County that attended the statewide 
conference were Elmer Harrison. 
Commissioner of Prect. 1; Bill Ather-
ton, Commissioner of Prect. 2; Bryan 
Close. Commissioner of Prect. 3: and 
Boyd Hiltbrunner, Commissioner of 
Prect. 4. 

MOBEETIE SCHOOL MENU 
Feb. 12-16 

MONDAY: Breakfast; Hot biscuits, 
sausage, bacon w/gravy, jelly, butter, 
milk, juice. 
Lunch; Polish sausage, pinto beans, 
corn on the cob, fruit, hot rolls 
wibutter, milk, tea. 
TUESDAY: Breakfast; Cinnamon 
toast, choice of cereal, fruit, juice, 
milk. 
Lunch; Chili or chicken soup, toss 
salad, French fries w/catsup, crack-
ers, hot rolls, honey, brownies, milk, 
tea. 
WEDNESDAY: Breakfast; Hot bis-
cuits, scrambled eggs, jelly, butter, 
juice, milk. 
Lunch; Steak, green beans, fried okra, 
cake, hot rolls. butter, milk, tea. 
THURSDAY: Breakfast; Buttered 
toast, hot cereal, jelly, juice. milk. 
Lunch; Taco casserole, corn, garden 
salact fruit cobbler, hot rolls, honey. 
butter, milk, tea. 
FRIDAY: Breakfast; Waffles, syrup. 
butter, sausage. bacon, juice. milk. 
Lunch; Hot dogs, chili, French fries 
wicatsup, toss salad. banana pud-
ding, milk, tea. 
Menu subject to change. 

TRACT VI (b): 
Beginning 660 feet due 

South of the Section Corner 
of Sections 21. 22, 27 and (Lease Option between 
28. Township 7 South, CARROLL-LASLEY) 

TRACT VI (a): 
Beginning at the '4 Sec- the NW ' of NW 3 4 of Sec- 
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