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ntive from the Dallas Salvation
Army Office, and Rev. Roger
Martin, pastor of the Presbyterian
Church in Littlefield and the local
campaign chairman. Staff Photo
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State Comptroller Bob Bullock
announced he is sending a repre-
sentative from his Lubbock office

to Littlefield Tuesday, Dec. 14, to
assistlocal taxpayers and answer
questions about statetaxes.

Bullock said Enforcement Of-

ficer Lillie Cross will meet with
local taxpayers at the Littlefield
Courthousebasementfrom 9 a.m.
to 12 p.m.

"If Littlefield-are- a merchants,
or anyone else for that matter,
have any questions about state
taxesor needhelp in preparingtax

Free tax

slated
All farmers and ranchers and

those with farm, ranch, business

and property interestsare invited

to attend a free tax seminar
concerning changes in estatetax

laws and changes in income tax

laws.
The tax seminar will begin at 7

p.m. Tuesday, Dec. 7, in the XIT

Room of the Security State Bank.

Only the first 40 who make

reservations will be able to attend.
Participation will be by reservation

only.
Contact Carol Black or Gloria

Jackson at Security State Bank by

phoning 385-513- 4 for reservations.

shop imnfiiiD nnsT

In their meetingThursday night,
the Littlefield City Council dis-

cussedthe ambulance costs to the
city and to the county, nnd asked
City Manager Greg Ingham to
work up a proposal for considera-
tion during their next meeting,
Dec. 16; conducted a public hear--

Swine Flu shots
to be given

at Olton
Swine Flu immunization clinics

are scheduled today at Sudan and
Olton in their respective school
cafeterias, from 12 noon to 5 p.m.

Dr. J. W. Chatwell of Amherst
will be in chargeof the innovat-
ions at Sudan, and Dr. Jack Hill-ma- n

of Plainview will direct the
program at Olton.
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forms, Mrs. Cross will be thereto
assistthem," Bullock said.

"We're trying to cut the red
tape in this office and we believe
these face-to-fac- e sessions with
taxpayers help do just that, "Bul-
lock added.

Bullock reminded those tax-

payers who are unable to meet

A group of Littlefield men have
organized a Littlefield Jaycees
organization and elected officers
and are already underway on their
first two projects.

Littlefield Jayceeshave initiated
a Toys for Tots project to collect
new and used toys for Christmas
presentsfor chil-

dren. In addition to collecting,
repairing and distributingtoys, the
Jaycees want to help senior citi-

zensof Littlefield to decorate their
homes for Christmas this year.

The Littlefield Jayceeswill re-

pairanyusedtoys that aredonated
to their project. Boxes will be set
up at participatingLittlefield mer-

chants so residentscan drop toys
in while shopping. Or they will

pick up toys. Call Curry Motor

Freight, 385-424- 4.

Seniorcitizens who areunableto
hang up their Christmas lights or
decorationswill be assistedby the
Jaycees.Jayceeswill bring ladders
and equipmentand hanglights for
older persons.Telephone Del Ezell
at 385-560- 8.

New officers include Ed Mc-Cona-

president;Charles Robi-so- n,

first vice president; C. E.
Dickerson, second vice president;
JoeMedina, treasurer,Bill Richey
and Paul Webb, directors; Gary
Shipley, reporter;andKenny Birk-elbac- h,

statedirector.
The purposeof this organization

is civic service through the orga-

nized efforts of the young menof

the community to promote the
welfare of the community and its
citizens through active, construc-

tive projects.

ing on the Community Develop-
ment Block Grant; elected three
members to the Texas Municipal
League Workmen's Compensation
Board of Trustees;discussed, but
took no action on personnel prob-
lems; and were updated on the
traffic problem at XIT, LFD,
Phelps and Highway 54.

During the discussion of the
ambulance situation, City Man-
ager Greg Ingham reminded the
council that the city also absorbs
the cost of gasoline in running the
ambulance, and he presenteda
total analysis of thecity's expendi-
tures, not included in monthly
billings to Lamb County.

Itemized in expenditures were:
personal services, S3,500; con-

tractual services,S75; supplies and
materials, S400; and fuel costs,
$1,68-9- a grand total of $5,664
per month.

News

StateComptroller's representative
to visit Littlefield Tuesday,Dec.14
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with his representativeson Dec.
14th that they may still get their
questions answered quickly by
calling his toll-fre- e tax information
numberin Austin:

The Lubbock office, headedby
Donald F. Paxton, servesLubbock
and surroundingcounties.

The internalpurpose of the Jay-

cees
t

is to build their young men
into productive leadersby having
leadershipcourses and projects.

Jayceesare hosting their wives
at their Tuesday night meeting,
Dec. 7, at 8 p.m. in thecommunity
room of the Tri-Coun- ty Savings
and Loan Building. All members
and their wives are urged to
attend.Othersinterestedin being
a part of this organization are
invited to attend and bring their
wives.
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LITTLEFIELD JAYCEES officers
for thecoming yearare,hack row,
Keasy Birkelbach, Gary Shipley,
Ed McCoaaha, and C. E. Dicker-bo- b.

Seated are Joe Medlaa,

Ambulance costs for the fiscal
year of 1975-7- 6 amounted to a
grand total of $34,430.73. Reve-

nues during that same period
amounted to $10,597.25, leaving a
total of $23,833.48 due from the
county.

Members of the city council
suggestedthat thecounty propose
to Amherst and Sudan to make a
contribution to help the county
with its share ofthe cost just as
Earth and Springlake do in the
north portion of the county.

Ingham advised the council that
they have approximately $6,000of
RevenueSharing money that could

SeeAMBULANCE, Page 2

Troy Gardner, Littlefield School
Board Trustee,submittedhis writ-

ten resignation Wednesday to the
board president, who in turn
submittedit to Jack York, superin--

SacredHeart Church

hosting festival

Sacred Heart Church is hosting
a Christmas festival today, Dec.
5th, from 12 noon until 6 p.m.

The County Agricultural and
Community Centeron Hall Avenue
is thesite for all the festivities and
SantaClaus will be a special guest
for the event.

All townspeople are invited to
spend the day shopping at the
Country store where home-mad-e

goodies and hand-crafte-d items
will be available for Christmas
gifts.

A double-be- d afghan, original
painting and potted plant are
being raffled off for only $1 a
ticket, and a rummage sale will

featuremany items.
Games include Bingo (some

prizes donated by local merchants
and also money prizes), a cake
walk, grab bag, balloon-dar-t
game, color wheel and basketball
toss. There'll be something for
everyone of every age.

Among the prizes donated by
merchants are: $30 certificate-Origi- nal

Tasty Taco; hairstyle,
shampoo, and conditioner The
Kut Hut; tune-u-p kit Teo'sAuto
Parts; combination dinner for
two Tasty Taco; $25 worth of
parts,or minor tune-u-p Cervan-te-z'

Auto Shop; S25 certificate
Littlefield Upholstery; $20 certifi-
cate First National Bank, Am-

herst; Towel set J. C. Penney
Co.; and jewelry Macha Seed.

Sandwiches, tamales, burritos,
Frito pies and beverageswill be
offered for eating.

Pictures will betaken with Santa
from 1 to 5 by Oecia'sPhotography
for S3.

Charles Robison and Billy Richey.
Jayceesaresponsoring a Toys for
Tot drive aad helping senior
citizesa decorate for Chriatnas for
their first two projects.
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PAT BRADLEY is now affiliated
with First National Bank, as of
Dec. 1. He was serving as person-
nel manager of the American
Cotton Growers'Textile Plant,and
hadbeenLittlefield's city manager
from 1970 to 1973. He went to
Edinburg as city manager from
1973 to 1975, and began duties
with the Textile Plant in February
1976. (Staff Photo

Troy Gardnerresigns
from SchoolBoard
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tendent.
Gardner advised the Leader-New- s

the resignation was for
personal reasons.

According to Superintendent
York, the board will meet in a
specially-calle-d meeting Monday
night, Dec. 6, at 7 p.m. in the High
School lunchroom to discuss the
resignation.

By law, the board can appoint
someone to serve the four-mon- th

term, until election time. Gard-

ner's term was to be up then.
Gardner'sletter reads:

"Gentlemen:
"With this letter I hereby sub-

mit by resignation from the Board
of Trusteesof the Littlefield Inde-

pendentSchoolDistrict.
"There is an education itself to

be gained from such an exper-
ience, evenin theshorttenurethat
I have been privileged to serve the
people in this capacity.

"I wish for this Board every
successin continuing the progres-

sion of achievement presently
being experienced. Thank you for
every assistancegiven me.

"May sincerity and wisdom be
your guide in every decision that
you make."

Sincerely
sTroy Gardner

Local health issues

set for discussion
Local views on health issueswill

be received during a local public
meeting for Lamb County, set
Tuesday night, Jan. 18, at 7 p.m.
in the Lamb County Electric
Coop's Willy Room in Littlefield.

Coordinator for thepublic meet-

ing will be Kenneth Day.
Members and board of directors

of the South Plains Health Sys-

tems, Inc., which are sponsoring
the meeting, will conduct a meet-tin- g

Thursday, Dec. 9, in Lubbock
in the Community Room of the
Georgeand HelenMahon Library,
1306 Ninth Street, to set forth a
processfor initially involving every
board member in a health plan
development process.

That meeting will begin at 7

p.m. with John H. Selby, M. D.,
chairman of the South Plains
Health Systems,Inc., presiding.

Littlefield merchants

invited to view

shoplifting film
Littlefield merchantsare invited

to attend a film on preventing
shoplifting.

The film will be shown Monday
night at 8 in the XIT Room of
Security StateBank.

Chief of Police JamesCox urges
all merchantsand their employees
to make plans to view the 20-min-

film. A police officer will be
on handto answerquestions.

There is no admission charge,
and refreshmentswill eeservedby
the Lamb County Leader-New- s.
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December1,1976

The LambCounty Leader-New- s

P. 0. Box 72
Littlefield. Texas 79339

Dear Editor:

There is probably nothing that
means more to our boys at
Christmas time than new clothing,
so again this year we are going to
try to outfit all of them through the
Christmas Suit Fund Project.

We have350 boys,sothejob is a
big one,but thanksto the help you
have given with the advance
publicity in the past, we have
alwaysbeenable to reachthe goal.
I do hopeyou can find a place for

the enclosedto help the boysagain
this year.

We alsowant to invite you to the
presentation of "His Love Reach-

ing," the Christmas Cantata that
our boys will be presenting in the
Boys RanchChapelon Dec. 17 and
18.

Supper in the dining hall will be
served at 6 p.m. on both nights,
with the Cantata at 8 p.m. on
Friday night and 7 p.m. on
Saturdaynight. I know you would
enjoy taking part in theseactivities
and alsomeeting someof the boys.

Thank you for any help you
might givethem with thenew suits
and I do hopeyou will come to the
Ranch whenever you can. With
best wishes for a Happy Holiday
Season.I am

Sincerelyyour,
Carl Farley's Boys Ranch

sLouie Hendricks
Louie Hendricks

c
AL MEDA BLACK

Services for Mrs. Al Meda
Black, 83, of Lubbock were con-

ducted Thursday afternoon in the
HendersonFuneral Home Chapel,
with Rev. C. R. Love, pastor of the
Bethel Assembly of God Church,
officiating.

Burial was in the City of
Lubbock Cemetery.

Mrs. Black died at 12:55 a.m.
Tuesday, Nov. 30, in Highland
Hospital of Lubbock.

She was a Lubbock resident
since 1947. moving there from
Paducah.Shewasa memberof the
Bethel Assembly of God Church.

Survivors include one son, Har-le-n

Black of Lubbock; four daugh-

ters. Mrs. W. M. Detwiler of
Earth. Mrs. J. H. Taylor of

I TODAY'S THOUGHT!
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How old is old? A 5 year old may

think grandma is old at 45.
Grandma, perhapsherself show-in- n

signs of gray, rarely refers to
her gay mother at 65 as old, or
vsvn getting old. When obituaries
show namesof friends aged 65 to
70. often you hear, "Gee, he
wnsn't so old." At age 80, one
of(en hears, "getting up there in
.wars."

Clothes are made to make one
look young (excepting certain
stalesat times.Cosmeticscreatea
vouthful glow from head to toe.
Wrinkle erasers do they really
work? . can be bought. These are
physical fallacies about age to
support another fallacy, "you are
ns old asyou feel." So again, how
old is old?

General Douglas MacArthur, at
nge75, answered it this way: "No-
body grows old by merely living a
number ofyears.People grow old
only by deserting their ideals.
Yearsmanywrinkle the skin but to
give up interest wrinkles the
soul." Come to think of it, his
definition is good advise... (Inci-

dentally, we like advice from time
lo time. Whether you agree or
disdgrce with what you read here,
write to us any time you wish.)

HammondFuneral Home
Tom Sawyer, manager
503 E. 5th, 385-512- 1

Amherst, 246-335- 1

SMBD.AIHHHIi LW HmW ""&&? 7HH BHKt, IHMmm, WwIOF?5JMiSl&,sr H :!

EDITOR

OBITUARIES

Leader-New-s:

To Littlefield Leader-New- s:

We at Whitharral would like to
expressour appreciation to you for

the fine coverage you gave our
football team.

All athletes like to see their
namein the paper, and at one time
or another you mentioned every
boy on the team.

I feel as though this helped our
team, knowing that we would be
covered by a newspaper.

Most newspaperswill give small
schoolsa little write-u- p if someone
will call the game in. but I know of

six games that the Leader-New-s

had someone there to cover the
game.

Again, thank you very much.

sCoach Jerry Miller

December1, 1976

Editor
Littlefield Lamb County Leader
Littlefield, Texas

Dear Editor:

As Whitharral correspondent,
we have been asked by our com-

munity to write and say a greatbig
"THANK YOU" for the excellent
coverage you gaveour football
team through the past season.

We are all very proud of them
andare looking forward to an even
betteryear next year.

Thanks Again,
Whitharral FootballFans

P.S. We also appreciate the
write-up- s on our basketball teams.

J
Lubbock, Mrs. F. M. Chancey of
Lubbock andMrs. D. G. Porter of
Amarillo; one sister, Mrs. Eunice
Polk of McAllen; 14 grandchildren
and 29 n.

Pallbearers were grandsons,
Franklin Detwiler, Gary Pringle,
Billy Joe Taylor, James Taylor,
LeonardPringle and Merle Porter.

DR. W. NEIL RECORD
Servicesfor Dr. W. Neil Record,

68, longtime South Plains Baptist
minister and Wayland Baptist
College administrator, were con-

ducted Thursday morning in First
Baptist Church of Plainview.

Dr. Roy C. McClung, president
of Wayland Baptist College, and
Dr. Carlos McLeod, pastor, offi-

ciated.
Burial was in Parklawn Memo-

rial Gardensunder the directon of
Lemons Funeral Home of Plain-vie-

Dr. Record died at 12:30 p.m.
Monday. Nov. 29, at Central Plains
GeneralHospitalafter suffering an
apparent heart attack.

A native of Kelvin. Ariz., Rec-
ord grew up in Phoenixwhere he
worked with the PhoenixTitle and
Trust Co. from 1923 to 1945. He
then moved to Plainview and
attended Wayland Baptist College
graduating summa cum laude in
1949, the first senior class.

While attending Wayland, he
was a minister at the Edmonson
Baptist Church. Record then
movedto Prescott,Ariz., where he
helpedstartGrand CanyonBaptist
College, At Grand Canyon,he was
business manager and taught Bi-

ble classesuntil 1951

He later moved to Tulia where
he was pastor of the First Baptist
Church until 1963. He then re-

turned to Plainview and served as
assistantto the president of Way-lan-d

Baptist College until 1970.
Recordbecamepastor of the First
Baptist Church in Lockney in 1970,
retiring in 1974.

Sincehis retirement,Recordhad
served as development adviser at
Wayland Baptist College and as
interim pastor of Fnona, Ralls,
Abernathy, Matador and Plain-vie- w

churches. He was a member
of the First Baptist Church of
Plainview.

Record was married to the
former Haley FarrarApril 28, 1927
in Phoenix, Ariz.

Survivors include his wife;
daughter, Mrs. C. T. (Mary Lu)
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"ASSASSINATION OF McKINLEY"

President illiam McKinley was attendinga public reception on September 6. 1901 at the
Exposition in New York City Among those waiting to shake hands with the

President was an American-bor- Polish anarchist The man reached with his left hand to

shake the President's hand and at the same time fired two shotswith a gun covered with

a handkerchief in his right hand President McKinley died on September 14. From the

collection of American S'atwnal Insurance Company, Galveston, Texas
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IF YOU WANT to serve baked
turkey for a special holiday meal,
but are afraid the meat will turn
out dry and unattractive, don't
despair.

The Texas Department of Agri-

culture home economist suggests
this method of preparingturkey.

With no basting and careful
watching, the turkey will be tender
and golden brown.

TURKEY-IN-THE-SAC- K

1 tsp. pepper
2 tsp. salt
3 tsp. paprika
4 tsp. hot water
1 cup peanutoil
1 turkey; 14 to 16 lbs.

Combine pepper, salt, paprika
and hotwater. Let standat least 10

minutes. Add peanut oil and mix
thoroughly.

Wash and dry turkey. Rub
peanut oil mixture into inside and
outside of turkey. Truss as de-

sired.
Pour remaining oil and addi-

tional oil into large paper sack
(type used in grocery stores). Rub
oil into inside of sack until every
pore in every inch of the sack is
sealed.

Place turkey in sack, breastup.
Fold over end of sack and tie
securely. Placeon cookie sheet.

Bake at 350 degrees, approxi-
mately 10 minutes per pound.
Before removing from sack, place
in a large pan to catch drippings.
Let stand 20 minutes before open-
ing the sack.

Since the sack is airtight, the
turkey is cooked by steam; there-
fore, be careful when sack is
opened.

TURKEY anddressingare tradi-
tional holiday meals.

But if you feel thatyou've gotten
into a rut serving the same
dressing time after time and would
like to try something new, the
Texas Department of Agriculture

Day of Oklahoma City; a sister,
Mrs. John Watson of Folsom,
Calif.; and two grandchildren.

ROY E. STEWART
Services for Roy Edmond Ste-

wart, 67, of Littlefield and a native
of Lubbock,wereconductedFriday
afternoon in Hammons Funeral
Home Chapel with Jack McCor-mic- k,

minister of the Ninth Strpet
Church of Christ, officiating, k

Burial followed in Littlefield
Memorial Park.

Stewart died about 6:45 p.m.
Wednesdayin Medical Arts Hospi-
tal.

Stewart was in the trucking and
grain business. He moved to
Littlefield 15 months ago from El
Paso. Stewart married Verdell
Jakesin 1933, in Roswell, N.M.

Survivors include his wife; a
son, Ronaldof El Paso;two sisters,
Mrs. Helen Bonaguidi of La Jolla,
Calif, and Mrs. Mickey McSpad-de- n

of Ruidoso, N.M.; and four
grandchildren.

suggestRice PecanDressing.

RICE PECAN DRESSING
1 pkg. 6 oz. long grain and wild
rice
3

4 cup sherry or chicken broth
1- -' j cups sliced celery

2 cup butter
1 pkg. 8 oz. herb stuffing mix
1 cup hot water
1 cup chopped pecans

Cook long grain and wild rice as
directed on package, substituting
sherry or broth for 3 cup water
called for in package recipe.

JL Meanwhile, sautecelery in but--

jter for two minutes. Add herb
stuffing mix, hot water and pe
cans; mix well. Add hot cooked
rice and mix. Serve with turkey.

CHEESE-FRUI- T DIET
Did you know that the famous

Persian philosopher, Zoroaster, in
the sixth or seventhcentury B. C.
lived for 30 days in the wilderness
on a dietof cheeseand fruit alone?
He emerged,recording the benefit
both to his healthand good spirits.

I Continued
ambulance--be

devoted to helping with the
purchaseof a new ambulance, and
the council recommended that the
funds be offered.

Ingham is to work up a proposal,
which will be submitted to the
county later, for the city's con-
sideration at the Dec. 16 meeting.

In discussing the community
development program summary
during a public hearing,the coun-
cil recommended to the city man-
ager that he take the areas that
most need water, sewer and street
improvementsand make proposals
for the council's consideration at
the next meeting.

Grants offered under the Hous-
ing and Community Development
Act may be for 100 percent of the
project costs and must be no less
than 850,000, nor more than
$250,000.

The council asked Ingham to
prorate out the possible improve-
ments to the maximum of
$250,000.

The council voted to elect the
three candidates listed on the
ballot for the Texas Municipal
LeagueWorkmen's Compensation
Board of Trustees.They are Abe
Allen, councilman from Abilene;
Juanita Brodecky, mayor of Rio
Hondo; and Don Cheatham, city
attorney of Amarillo.

Setting a screw in wood can
be madeeasierif the threads
are first coated with soap.

By COKNRALl. BLEVINS

Brandon

FELT PRETTYGOOD at theend

of last Sunday. 1 hadn't had to

suffer through anothergamewith

the Dallas Cowboys. Honestly, I

think those guys aregonna be the
death of me, yet! Just know, if

they makeit to the playoffs, ngain,

I'm done for.
Anyway, last Sunday wasn't

much different from the others,
except for the fact that this time

they didn't suit-u-p. But, root for

them, I do! Hope they wake up

soon.

THERE'S A LOT of uneasy
feelin' goin' around about the
plight of our savings accounts in
the face of continued, and in-

creased inflation. The idea of our
storing up quarter-size-d dollars,

that are sure to turn into the
ten-ce- nt variety, is causin' a lot of
scare talk.

This kind of thing has been
going on every since Nov. 2nd.
There arethosethat pooh-poo-h the
idea of therebeing any difference,
whether Ford, or Carter had been
the winner. However there's a
good many of our people who are
having' second thoughtsabout the
matter.

IT MIGHT BE a good idea to get
yourself a copy of thecurrentNews
and World Report. On page24 of
said issue, there's a brief, and to
thepoint list of the major promises
Mr. Carterhasmade to gethimself
into office.

While most of us hate to be lied
to, we'd better hope that he's
already discardeda lot of those
wild and irresponsible promises.
So what if everyone does have a
ten-doll- ar per hour job, and cotton
IS bringing S2 per pound; how

A Woman's
By Pearl

I MISSED another week from
writing this column as I was too ill
to think of it in time to get it to the
office.

I am home again and feeling
much better.The Lord has blessed
me in many ways and I am
thankful, especially to be home
again.

LIFE IS GOOD as long as you
can care for yourself, but I have
heard many old people pray for
deathto come. It is pitiful for old
people with sick bodies to keep on
living.

from Page1 I

shootin'
evil to let the seedof hatreddie
and the seedof love flourish. He
astonished the Pilgrims by calling
to them in English and he ap-

proached them as a friend.
It was Squanto who showed

them the hunting, fishing and
farming skill of the Indians. It was
he who acted as ambassadorfrom
the Pilgrim colony to the power-
ful Indian tribe headed by the
greatchief, Massasoit.The colony
might have survived without the
help of Squanto, but his help
surely lessenedhunger, lightened
hardship, and saved some lives
which might otherwise have been
lost.

Each of us in our pilgrimage
through life is faced with Squan-to'-s

choice. Shall wo remember
and seek revengefor every injury,
real or fancied?Or shall we seek to
repay only those who have been
helpful? One thing is certai-n- if
we keep ourselves busy recogniz-
ing and appreciatingtho good that
comesour way, we will be happier
for it.
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One Day Service
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C&O CLEANERS

628 Farwell Ave.

Shop Littlefield First

A Banker'sViewpoint....

Connerof Springlake, Mrs. Jimmy
D. Duke and Mrs. JamesGrimes
of Littlefield.

The former Lois Taylor and
Offield were married Dec. 22, 1926
in Bailey County. They farmed in
Dickens before moving to Little-fiel- d

in 1941, where they were in
businessbefore retiring.

The couple has 24 grandchil-dre-n

and 12 n.

All friends and relatives are
invited to attendthe reception.

Dick McDaniel family
honoredwith housewarming

AMHERS- T- The Dick McDan-
iel family was honored with a
housewarming in their new home,
Monday evening, Nov. 29th.

After a prayer dedication by
Rev. Glenn Willson, Dick, Bar-

bara, Jamie and Cindy were
presentedwith a "money wreath"
along with the good wishes of
many friends and neighbors.

Other gifts were on display in
the "sun room" where guests
were served punch, coffee and
assortedcookies.

Peggy Bales, Margie Harmon
and Linda Bearden served from a
table laid with an antique satin
cloth and featuring a centerpiece
of autumn flowers in a brown cut-gla-ss

bowl.
Hosts for the occasion were

Messrs. and Mesdames Lilburn
Bales, Barry Bearden, J. P. Brant-
ley, Bob Brantley, Clyde Brown-lo- w,

Verdell Burton, Jimmy Cow-

an, Raymond Duvall, Ledford En-lo- e,

Winston Ferguson, Jomeryl
Harmon, Arthur Hedges, James
Holland, W. P. Holland Sr.. Troy
Jones,Eddie Landers, Leroy Max-fiel- d,

Alvin Messamore, Charles

LONGER LIFE
A child born in 1900 could

expect to live an average of about
47 years A child born in 1974
could expect to live an average of
72 years.

They're trying a new experiment in Philadelphia.
School pupils in 17 of the city's schools show up

neatly dressed,they march in lines to their classes,recite
the Pledgeof Allegiance, and they study the 3Rs.

Emphasis in these 17 schools is on discipline, good
manners,patriotism and learning.

The kids who study their lessons and pass final
examinations can move up to the next grade Those who
don't are flunked. Report cards show actual achieve-

ment on solid subjects like arithmetic, reading, writing
and history.

The dress code requires neatnessand cleanliness.
A principal explains: "Children act the way they are
dressed. When they are dressed well they feel proud.
The tenorof school thisyear is much quieter."

And the children are learning more.
A great many people years agocould have forecast

such results. After all, schools did a good job for scores
of years by requiring performance.Results ebbed only
when courseswere watered down, passing to the next
gradebecamea "right", and discipline relaxed.

What is especially hearteningabout the Philadel-
phia situation is this: Parents of all economic levels, all

ethnic backgrounds, have given the program overwhelm-"i-g

support.
Originally Philadelphia's school system planned to

operate only one "back-to-basic-s" school as an experi-

ment. Parentscould send their children to this school on
a purely voluntary basis.

Responsewas so great that it took 17 schools to
meet this year's demand,and many more are expected
to be made available next year.

Nearly all parents,after all, want their children to
be educated,not merely passedthrough a set of grades.
And they want their children to behavethemselves.

Philadelphia's experience proves these points,
well as anothermore important one. Teachers in the

experimental schools, which have only returned to old-'im- e

methods of teaching, say the children are learning
more - much more.

Heartening,isn't it?

The above is published as a public service by the
"rity StateBank. We areproud of Littlefield Schools,

Teachers,Administrators and Trustees,as well as the
nerschools in our area.We appreciatetheir attitudeon

611 "basics" and hope they will continue to stressthe
Pciesand virtues mentioned above.

MR. AND MRS. ALFRED OFFIELD

Mixon, Harvey Patterson,Alfred
Schroeder, Keith Tomes, and D.
D. Yantis.

Special guests were Barbara's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. A.
Chester from Littlefield.

More than 80 guestsregistered
and toured the home during the
evening.
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FHA style show, supperfete mothers
ANTON supper

style hosted members
Anton honoring

mothers Monday night
school cafetorium.

tables decorated
streamers centerpieces

featuring Christmas bells.
Placcmats emphasizing proper

mothers-to-b-e provided
Student Council SCORE pro-

ject
stage living

fireplace decorated
Christmas stockings
candelabra votive

Christmas blink-

ing lights, golden garlands
tinsel, colored decorations

completed
Boothe narrated

Night Before Christmas" accom-
panied Stephens
background piano music.

Junior homemaking students
modeled clothing pro-

jects. Nancy Herrin Beatrice
Synatschk.led style show.
They modeled pant-suit-s.

Then, Rendon,
Rendon, Olga modeled
pantsuits

Hooper camel

Mrx,

colored corduroy printed
Sherri Dutton modeled

denim pantsuit

Cecile Herrin,
corduroy pantsuit; Dcmaris

Walthall, corduroy pant-
suit Kathy Bailey,

jacket, completed
projects.

Home projects modeled
Susan Harper, velour
robe; Barbara
jumper; Nancy Herrin, deep

jumper; Cecile Herrin,

Jump modeled
Gossett, Olga Luna,

Beatrice Synatschk.
Tracy Green modeled floor-leng- th

dotted Swiss.
Rendon showed floor-leng- th

party
made.

Demaris Walthall
showed pantsuits.

arrival
given

Nick,"
mighty
Guests attending Mmes.
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Jim Billings, Sammie Norman,
JamesOwens, Louis Boothe, Zado
Hooper, Johnie Harper, Jr., Ere-len- e

Webb, Wnnda Walthall, Lin-d- y

Barnes, Owen Johnson, Jose
Garcia, Trinidad Rendon, Frank
Arocha, Bill Goen, Claud Goen,
Brady Goen, Mamie Stewart, L. J.
Griggs, J. D. Harrell, Bob Harrell,
Bud Stone, Harold Green, Buck
Gossett, Sid Landers, Eddie Bi-

shop, Walter Hobgood, JoseLuna,
Ed Hart, Bettie Herrin, Herbert
Synatschk, Vernon Stone, Richard
Grace, Reggie Stephens, James
Grace, Jerry Dutton, Harlan
White, W. G. Stolk, and Mrs.
Bonnie Beadles, FHA advisor.
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uawards-Moor-e

weddingslated
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Edwards of

Amherst announce the engage-
ment and approachingmarriage of
their daughter, Sheila Ann Ed-war-

to Lucian Don Moore, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Lucian Moore of
Acuff.

The bride-ele- ct is a 1972 grad-
uate of Amherst High School.

The prospective bridegroom is a
1969 graduateof Roosevelt High
School.

The wedding is planned for Dec.
11, 7:30 p.m. in the home of the
bride'sparents.

Goin' Bandfrom Raiderland concert
Twirling batons, swaying flags

and music from "The Goin' Band
From Raiderland" will fill the
Municipal Coliseum Saturday,

SHEILA AND

MOORE

Dec. 11, for fourth annual
Band Scholarship Con-

cert.
The p.m. will
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BULA Mrs. Terry Sowderwas
honored with lullaby shower
Tuesday Nov. 30, from

to p.m. in the home of Mrs.
Bonnie Claunch.

The serving table was laid with
white lace over yellow, with an
arrangement of fresh yellow dais-
ies.

Yellow punch, coffee,along with
white cake squares, nuts and

chunks were served by
the hostessesto the 20 gueststhat
registered.

The honoree, her mother, Mrs.
Kuehler and Mrs. Bill Sowderwere

sets
Marching

afternoon,

pineapple

feature the 427-pie- marching
band of Texas Tech University.
Films also will be shown from
some of the performances of the
band.

The band recently was pictured
on the cover of the nationally
published "Instrumentalist."

Director Dean Killion said the
showis "for all agesand themusic
will be enjoyed by the whole
family."

Tickets may be purchased from
any Downtown Kiwanis Club
member for S2 for adults and SI for
students.Band members are also
selling tickets tickets may be
obtained from the band office at
(806) 742-227- 2.

The money will go towards
students band scholarships for
1977.

TAKE OUT STUFFING
Always removethe stuffing from
turkey before storing in the

refrigerator. Leftover stuffing
should be thoroughly heated be-

fore serving again.
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Music Box

Just In Time For Christmus Giving

Made from Europeanor African
Walnut, rose wood, mahogany,
briarwood, orange wood or thule.

Hand made musical movements to
strike the proper note at the precise,
split second.
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Lullaby showerhonors
Terry Sowder infant
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corsagesof baby sox to
wear during the afternoon.

The honorco was assisted in
opening her wrapped packagesby
her mother, Mrs. Kuehler and
Mrs. Sowder, while her sister,
Mrs. Rice registeredthe gifts in
the baby book.

Among the pretty and useful
gifts presentedto the honoree,was
a package from the hostess con-

taining, five crib sheets, bed
bumpers, snuggle pillow and com-

forter.
Hostesses Mrs.

Claunch were: Mrs. Loyd Pollard,
Mrs. Robert Claunch, Mrs. Buck
Medlin, Mrs. I. L. Clawson, Mrs.
Dewitt Tiller, Mrs. Wanda Legan,
Mrs. Myrna Turney, Mrs. Tom
Newton, Mrs. R. T. Newton, Mrs.
Dennis Turney, and Mrs. Cecil
Jones.

Special guests for the evening
were the honoree'smother, Mrs.
Louis Kuehler, and sisters, Mrs.
Debbie Rice and Mrs. Betty Lyons
of Morton and Mrs. Bill Sowder of
Bula.

S-S-gt. Bill Foste

participating in

Hawaiian training

Army Staff Sergeant Bill W.
Foster, son of Mr. and Mrs. Hollis
H. Foster of Littlefield, is partici-
patingin a 30-da- y trainingexercise
at the PohakuloaTraining Area on
the Island of Hawaii.

The annual trainingincludes live
fire with small arms, defensive
operations, withdrawal undersim-
ulated enemy pressure,crew drills
and platoon individual training as
well as night tactical operations.

Sgt. Foster is a team chief in the
25th Infantry Division at Schofield
Barracks, Hawaii.

His wife, Debby, lives in Wahia-w- a,

Hawaii.
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MRS. PEGGY SAVAGE was
honored with a surprise going-awa-y

party Saturday morning in
home of Mrs. Bill Richey.

Members of Naomi-Rut- h Circle of
Methodist Church presented

her with a "West Texas
Arrangement." Mrs. Savage is
moving to South Dakota.

MRS. FINCH
recently in the home of her
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. BoTby
Brunson.

MISS NINA McBride hasbeena
patient in Medical Arts Hospital.
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Girl ScoutNews

Z new column which will

Id Girl Scouts will report

ial activities they have

solved in nnu iu u

..i no uip 1 as activities

tjt!re town unit will work on

.. ..

i month's repon. is on
nVVlllL 11UUM wM """

posedof first grade girls, ages

350 held it's first meeting
jonday,!)epi.is. !""tointroduce the girls to each

ff their leaders, and a general
.'ir.irl Scout principles. It was
1(jed to hold weekly meetings
todays from 3:3ino4UU p.m.

i nas r niun V

at name lags wea-- uiu UJ-

hgirltotell abouther interests.
. iTip October meetings the
'. nf heinc a Brownie were
irticed. These include the
umerromise, """- - "- - .

trie Sign and Handshake,
Li. storv. Flag ceremony,

wie songs, and ceremonies to

4 and end meeting.
rrk eirls made paper-sac-k

Lets of characters in the
fame story during mu mumn

nOct. 25 drew three large
i.oll Dosters for Staci Birkel- -

th who had been unable to
ai meetinas due to illness.
Member started off with the
ownie Investiture Ceremony on
:aday, Nov. 8. The girls started
Uremonv with the Flag cere--
Land oledce of allegiance.

Each girl then explained part of
'ideas of Brownies and the

lop sangsomeof the songsthey
Ij learned.

Each girl was then led to a
blated forest pond to tell why
levanted to be a Brownie, say

r Brownie Promise, and receive
r Brownie nn.
Uter closing the ceremony with
e Friendship song and ring, the
Jj served cake and punch to
sir relatives attending.
Ike forest scenery for the cere--

cj was designed and arranged
itroop father, Roger Franklin.

Saow caused the Nov. 15 meet--
lobe cancelled.

On Nov. 22 the girls made
iey tray favors out of egg
tons and filled them with candy.
Itese were taken to the Hospi--
ij House to be usedon Thanks-'.n-g

Day.
On Nov. 29 the girls decided to

t shut-in- s for their Christmas
My on Dec. 20.
Gifts were startedfor the girls to

--tu them when they go and
J will sing carols at each home

--7 Wit.
After they make their visits thev

"J return to the Scout Hut for
ftshments and a gift exchange.
'dunne the month of Decem

berwill make decorationsand
fnts to take home.

Merest of the year will include
activities as the cookie

e tather-DauKht- nieht. Girl

v

Week and Brownie Play

wklmas breads
'ta demonstrated
karn how to prepare delicious
"U3 tor Unstmasthis year by
'endinE "Christmnn n.HoN the World" in the Flame
m a' Pioneer Nnhirnl fin
aPny Monday, Dec. 6 at 7
"'hoseattendingwill receive a

Innstmnc n: ni.
I,()r morfi infn: II nne"""'"'""" Mill
IlTl RSVP by noon Dec. 3.

BUY YOUR

DRBY VACUUM

CLEANER
AT DEALER COST

Save 100
OR MORE

See The Kirby

A,817E.9rh.
Or fnll OOc

DEMONSTRATIONS

Yby Sales
ServW

m

The National Girl Scout organi-
zation has authorized patches for
Brownies for the first time this
year which will be basedon the
Brownie "By. So individual
troop activities will be planned on
helping the girls in the Brownie
"B's", which are, Be Discovers,
Be Ready Helpers, and Be Friend-Maker- s.

Troop 350 members are Stacey
Archer, Frances Arenivaz, Staci
Birkelbach, Tammi Dempsey,
Kristi Eddings, Missy Enloe, Bob-b- i

Franklin, Angela Heard, Nicky
Larrabee, Amy Lawson, Maria
Martinez, Brandi Mooney, Christi
Pierce, Susan Pierce, Shelley
Potts, Ketha Puente, Letitia Trim-
mer, and Patty Yohner.

Troop leader is Mrs. Barbara
Franklin; assistant leaders are
Mrs. Kay Lawson, Mrs. Majorie
Pierce, and Mrs. Sandi Mooney;
troop committee members are
Mrs. Emma Puente, Mrs. Beverly
Trimmer and Mrs. Kathy Eddings.

Troop Cookie Sale Chairman is
Mrs. Debbie Pierce.

Stacy's
Annual

Brings
You

.'7

Tea Cart Plant

Stand

9 lTw3

MISS SOUTH PLAINS Maid of
Cotton, Allison Mynott, second
from left, toured the American
Cotton Growers' Denim Textile
Plant Thursday, and following her
tour shechattedwith Aaron Rich-

ardson, plant superintendent;
Cheryl Yarbrough, assistantper- -

Progressivedinner members

Homemakers held their
Thanksgiving progressive

Nov. 18.

They in the home
of Janet themain course

Of &

- For

Or

The Future
annual
dinner

night,

had
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sonnell director; andTerry Stark of
Lubbock, ag managerof the Lub-
bock Chamber of Commerce and
Maid of Cotton Miss
Mynott is a student at Woyland
Baptist College in Plainview.

Staff Photo

fetes FHA

Thursday

appetizers
Kristinek;

in the home of Rozanne Polk, and
dessert in the home of Carolyn
Benton.

The FHA girls were accom-
panied by their advisor, Rosemary
Corkery, and FHA mothers, Tru-di- e

Bryant and Rosetta Polki

Fall Sale
Beautiful Gifts

The

Or

$1

Great

Chairs

Plant

Large Planter
Beautiful

$1295 995 49995 1995

Accent Tables

Choice Styles

Finishes

Between

Stands.

WHITHARRA- L-

White

Hand Decorated-Seepeti-ne

RealElegance

Reg. $29995

chaperone.

$

t

GameTable
Plant Stand
Reg. '1295

Reg. Reg.

Front

I9995

Reg. '595 $3995

GrandfatherClocks Choose

8 Different Styles-Differe- nt Movements

Some Moon Dials

Our Now $299

13LIROWNFIELD LEVELIANO UTTUmtl OOCMA

cWMMte
HOME FURNISHINGS
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Hospital Auxiliary
slatesgift sale

The Hospital Auxiliary of Little-fiel- d

will conduct their gift sale
Tuesday, Dec. 7, ut both hospitals.

Gift items suitable for family,
teachers,or friends will be avail-
able, and proceeds will go into
fund for nursing scholarships.

A FIRE HAZARD
Do not use electric blankets on

babies. They tend to roll blankets
into balls, which can increase fire
hazard.

assssssssssssssssssssssssss

k llUV
Vacuum
Cleaners

SALES AND SERVICE

Pat'sRecord
Center

APPLIANCE DEPARTMENT

Here Is Warm & DurableLook Of DurableOak

iM&t&L "tfllKHMSKb ' ' tkii. ' A.-

$6995

Antique secretary

-

- From

With- -

Reg.$399

a

a

'l

Tier Planter
Library Steps
Reg 812995

$6995

III B jflH I

Vf? VI 110 HI

1 Kj(

mm

CreditTerms FreeDelivery

teuthorl rwr.

(1
Read

this adwith
your pencil.

Below is a specially prepared
check list if you're interested in a

retirementplan

SELF EMPLOYED PERSONS

C I am not currently covered
by any retirementplan.

G I would like a tax free retire-
ment plan for my employ-
ees.

J I want to earn top interest
on my retirement invest-
ment with absolutely no fi-

nancialrisk.

1 I would like to be able to
deposit up to $7,500 yearly,
without paying federal in-

come taxes on the

EMPLOYED PERSONS

C I am not covered by a pen-
sion plan where I work.

C I would like to provide my-

self with a comfortable re-

tirement income.
X

D I would like to beable to de-

posit up to $1,500 yearly,
without paying federal In-

come taxes on the invest-
ment.

C I want to earn top interest
on my retirement invest-
ment with absolutely no f-

inancial risk.

If you checkedall four points in
your employment category, you
need IRSA (the Individual Retire-
ment Savings Account) or the new
Keogh plan. Come In and let's
talk it over. We pay the highest
ratesavailable on your retirement
funds.

RETIREMENT SAVINGS DEPOSITS
IN BY DECEMBER 31

ARE DEDUCTIBLEON YOUR

1976INCOMETAX RETURN.

CZEDERAL
of Littlefield

"the bestone for your money"

301 XIT Drive

Littlefield, Texas
385-519-

Member FSLIC
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'Up the Down Staircase'to be stagedThursday
Littlefield High School will pre-

sent its ol play, "Up the
Down Staircase," Thurs-
day, Dec. 9th, at 7:30 p.m. in the
High School auditorium.

An admission price of $2 for
adults, $1 for students, and 75
cents for elementary studentswill
be charged and proceedsfrom the
play will go to the Junior-Senio- r

Banquet and the All-Scho- ol

" v

nKM

The play will be under the
direction of Mrs. Jerry Blakely,
and assistant directors, Mrs. Lu-

cille Betts and Dale Thurman.
A classroomwill be the atmos-

phere of the play.
Parts will be acted out by Mark

Rodenas Dr. Maxwell Clarke, the
high school principal; Terri Bell as
Sylvia Barrett; Michelle Lowrance
as Beatrice Schachter; and Todd
Stafford as Paul Barringer all of

in h t m f

:
;r.c

w"I
mmrmmm fr j fW

IBS':,

- - '

4

Vrm f 0 l C

whom will portray members of the
faculty.

Members of the school staffwill
be actedout by Ben Davidson as J.
J. Tana Ratliff as Ella

Karla McCanlis as
Frances Egan, Darla Nichols as
Charlotte and Richard Rog-

ers as Samuel Bester.
Students in Room 304 will be

acted out by Patty Bryant as
Finch, Ronnie Martin as

You're Invited To Attend A

TAX SEMINAR

On ChangesIn Income Tax Laws

And In EstateTax Laws

Tuesday,Dec. 7th At 7:00 P.M.

In The XIT Room Of Security StateBank

ReservationsMust Be Made

With Carol Black Gloria Jackson.

Only The 40 To Call 385-513-4 Can Be Accommodated

I
A

h

- -

V&J. twTT

MSl

Your Community Service Bank

Wolf,

Saddie

Qr

FREE FREE
RegisterFor Free ChristmasGift From Crafton Glass.

frnm

WHEN IT COMES TO MIRRORS, WINDSHIELDS,

STORE FRONTS, PATIOS OR ANY TYPE OF GLASS.

Crafton Glass
Home Owned & OperatedBy Doc Phariss

817 Hall Ave.
BetweenDavid Bell Cadillac And Merlin's Food

385-352- 6 Days Nights 385-605- 2

& 24 Hour EmergencyService

McHabe,
Friedenberg,

First

i t

Lou Martin, Lewis Willey as

Lennie Nowmark, Rnna Wheeler

as Carole Blanca, Dana West as

Alice Blake, Kristi Altman as Viv-

ian Rosen,Kevin Aduddell asJose

Rodriguez, Gloria Brockington as

Carrie Blaine, Robert Wallace as

Harry Kagen, Jill Hinckley as Jill

Norris, Diane Jones as Rachel

Gordon, Chris Bradley as Eliza-

beth Ellis, Will Burks as Charles

Aarons, Ary McCanick as Edward

Williams, Bruce Harlan as Joe

Ferone, Lisa Fowler as Helen

Arbuzzi, JaniceCowen asFrancine

Gardner, Karla Wren as Katherine

Wolzow, and Susan Ogerly as

Ellen.
Voices heard will be by David

Smith and Joey Zahn.
Lights and curtains will be

controlled by Ricky Wright, Eric

Gilliam, Lynn Duffey, and Jerry
Cowen.

The publicity committee is com-

posedof David Smith, Joey Zahn,

BlakeAltman, ToddStafford, Terri
Bell, Mark Roden, Michelle Low-

rance, George Davis, and Bloke

Wood.

Stage crew members will be

under the direction of stage fore-

man, Robert Hill. The rest of the
stagecrew is made up of Melvin
Hall, Kenneth Donnell, Jack Hall,
Mickey Oglesby, Crockett Patter-

son, John Shipp, Joe Don Haynes,
Butch Smith, and Chris Newton.

LITTLEFIELD

MR. AND MRS. Conal Norrie
and Cyndi spent Thanksgiving in
Greenwood,Ark., visiting Mr. and
Mrs. Bill Farr.

MRS. JIMMY McMillan visited
Thursday in Lubbock with her
mother, Mrs. Bertha Saylesof Ft.
Worth.

We're Giving

Away A

MIRROR 153
37 Inchesx 57 Inches

And A

BACK SLIDING

GLASS FOR

PICKUPS

DRAWING

TO BE HELD

DEC. 22nd

DON'T HAVE

TO BE PRESENT

TO WIN.

NOTHING TO

BUY.

Thanks For Giving Us

Your Next Brtak.

NEWS

YOU

tf&
i'V
Vi

MEMBERS of the Alpha Lambda
Zeta chapterof Beta Sigma Phi
screened primary studentsFriday
for ambliopia and other eye prob-

lems, as a service project for the
Texas Society for Prevention of
Blindness. Doing the screening

SCHOOL

MENU

DEC. 0

MONDAY: Beanie wieners,
green salad, creamed potatoes,
peanut butter cookies, hot rolls
and milk.

TUESDAY: Chicken fried steak,
orange pineapple Jello, early June
peas,hot rolls, 4 apple and milk.

WEDNESDAY: Sloppy Joes,
carrot sticks, whole kernel corn,
blackeyed peas, coconut pudding
and milk.

THURSDAY: Braised beef, rice
and gravy, fluffy potatoes, green
beans, bread,cinnamon rolls and
milk.

FRIDAY: Ham, sweet potatoes,
peas and carrots, hot rolls, peach
cobbler, milk and orange juice.

f&
&&y

'r

QCZDCTD

poumwcml. rewdcntim--

'Z.J,

Aq
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jA

X

&

Airra

i

4t

ftty

-

v

BSmbkcr" --a

LV

thatmornlnawnmn... j r

Darlene MnrfinU j n .

Crs. Studnntn nm I.e. .

Cody Peugh, Brady Waters

vruucii, narue Healy and

niciiurason, getting read; I

test. Staff Photo)

r

Thought

For The Dny

The measureof man'

characteris what he would!

if he knew he uould nel

be caught.

Jewell's

1609 W. 10th

385-511-2

04m,tmim

E3

Hospitality

jg

Growing old is becoming

popular.

1 (tig .

&.

Li

House
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L Wilson, Whitharral, Cot--
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the Anton tournament.
V,k eirls and boys were

lr.I2-JL-
roUed w a w-i- - .. .

j...mnH Pnn Hrtva
jhorns aowiicu -.- ,-

L'sgirls' team waspacedby

Thompson's 32 points and
a,

Gray's 27 points. Pep's top
Marilyn Green and

ers were

ITanxuii o !"" --- ---

Longhorns were lea py

Come out and meet your friends

ttODUCT

4in&M,n0.;i

te
IWiCEPniio

RWimmB
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N
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100
250

120

100
250

100
250
180

100

Johnny Elizondo's 22 point effort.
Also in double brackets were Lynn
Cowan with 19 and
with 18.

Pep'sBuffaloes were paced the
point output of Stanley Albus.

Wilson basketball teams
took a pair of wins by defeating
Lazbuddie 68-3-8 in the girls game
and 78-5-0 the boys' game.

The Whitharral Panthers col-
lected a win over the Hornets of
Sudan.The Pantherslost thegirls'
game but won the boys'
game61-4-8.

Bzzainn.
iiSDAY MIGHT BUFFET t , 89

you can eat P.M. I

j Hall Ave, bedell Black, Owner 385-52- 42

e3

YOU ARE CORDIALLY INVITED TO ATTEND OUR

REVIVAL

Hear Evangelist Lawanda Bullock

Special Singing By Rex Bullock

DEC 5'lfc 7:30 NIGHTLY

Bible Missionary Church
JAMES Pastor

1321 IEST 6th LITTLEFIELD, TEXAS

GuessWho.

pfflBci

Be First

To GuessWho

And An

8 Track
Turn Your Guess

In At The Store

n$2rx

I WESTERNAUTO 1 I

Phelps 385-42- 14

PyMultiple
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50
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also

49-5-1
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The

Win
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REG. PROM.
SIZE RETAIL RETAIL

2.75
6.25
3.85
6.95

$12.50
1.85
3.95
3.95
695

$16.95
4,89
7.95

75

$4 95

$13.49
3.99

""eptSundayAnd Monday.

1.99
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PRODUCT

406 VITAMIN E 200 1. U.

Mixed

411 VITAMIN E 1000 1.U.

Mixed

412 VITAMIN E 1000 1. U.

D'Alpha

415 VITAMIN E 200 1.U.

D' Alpha

507
Multiple Minerals

IW f--'--- ! J.A X v r5:30 P.M.

Cheri Hisaw netted21 points for
the losers. RoxannPolk was also in
double figures Whitharral with
13.

The Sudan girls were led by De
Anna Flowers and Terri Chester's
20 and 16 points

Whitharral boys were paced by
Jimmy Avery's 25 points. Others
in double columns for the Panthers
were Jimmy Polk with 12, and
Roger with 12.

EdgarTamplin pacedthe losers
with 16 points.

Anton and Cotton Center split
gameswith Cotton Centerwinning
the girl's contest60-4- 1. The Anton
Bulldogs the boys' game
58-4- 5.

Cotton Center'sgirls were paced
by SusieBlack's 23 points. Ginger
Black was also in double figures
with 15. The were
pacedby NancyHerrin's 23 points.

Lon Timms was top scorer for
Anton with 18 points. Mike Sea
and Rex Joneseach scored 12 and
10 points.

Cotton Centerwas led by Way-Io- n

Ashby and Johnny Davis each
with 10 points.

Froshgirls
win opener
at Amherst

The Littlefield freshman girls
romped the Amherst JV 55-3-2 in

first round action.
Bridgett Twitty paced the Cats

with a whopping 21 points. Robin
Messer was also in double figures
with 10;

Others scoring for the Catswere
Danna Joneswith 9, Jamie Lee
with 7, Elaine Turner with 2,
Geanice Ward with 2, and Tisha
Martinez with 2.

Top netters for Amherst were
Christi Milcox with 12, and Terri
Cowanwith 11.

The freshman girls were rid-del- ed

by Dimmitt 27-3- 0.

Twitty ripped the nets with 19

points to lead all scorers. Lee had
six for the night while Martinez
added a bucket to round the
scoring.

SandraHealy, Vonna Sander-

son, Gloria and Dar-len- e

Williams were each recog-
nized for their defensive work.

MORE SPORTS

ON
PAGE SEC.
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Tocopherols

Tocopherols

Tocopherol

Tocopherol

HYDRO-MI-

performance.

Rodriguez

Bulldoggetts

Thursday's

Brockington,

0bbIb9bbbH

wLiB

ACIDOPHILUS CULTURE oz.

,nceProductsCo. Alhambra,Ca 91802

in? nnir i?nnn TF.NTFJR
X

To

for

won

out

9,

I

a

SIZE

100
250
30
50

100

30
50

100

100
250
100
250

601 16

10

La

REG. PROM.
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$ 5.25
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$21.30
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$21.30
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$11.95
$ 2.95
$ 6.65
$ 2.50
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$ 9.49
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in Kress
The Littlefield Wildcats upped

their record to 2-- 2 after dumping
Silverton 62-4- 8 in first round action
of the Kress tournament.

At the end of the first period the
Wildcats held a slight 10-- 8 edge
over the Owls. During the second
period of play neitherteam had the
hot handastheCatsonly scored 15

points while Silverton scored 12 to
make the score 25-2- 0 at the half.

Both teamswere able to score 16
points in the third period to give
the Cats the edge 41-3- 6.

Varsity girls
slap Happy

The Littlefield girls varsity team
bounced back from their first loss
of the seasonand thrashedHappy
66-4-6 Friday in the Kress Tourney.

The Lady Wildcats lost to a tall
Silverton team by six points in the
opening round of the tourney.

The Wildcats jumped out to a
12--7 lead over Happy at the end of
the first quarter and then upped
the to 35-1- 9 at half.
After three periods the Cats led
49-3- 6.

Pennie'Sexton bombed in 25 to
pace the Cats scoring attack.
Monica Phillips tallied 23 and
Carol Sexton 11. Wanda Williams
added six and Rhonda Hollings-hea- d

two.
A. Payne of Happy was the

game'shigh scorer with 30 points.

USjK?IB

HORMEL

BACON
TENNESEE

HAMS

SUNDAY,

advantage

WILSON

WIENERS
HORMEL

PORK LINKS
RANCH STYLE

SHURFRESH

111141!

FILTERS

COCA COLA
VIKTOR OR SHURFINE

ALUMINUM
DIAL

ANT1.PFRCP1DANTHH I Eiwi IIVHH
TEXIZE

SPRAY &

ANTIFREEZE
SHURFINE

DECEMBER

w E9
TEXAS

ORANGES bag
MARYLAND CLUB

COFFEE

SMRFRtSH
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JVs win first round
Littlefield JV teams won a pair

of games in the Lockney tourna-
ment againstOlton. The
girls won their game by a 61-4- 1

verdict to lift their record to 6--0.

The boys defeated the
59-2- 7 to even their record at 2-- 2.

Cats dump Owls tourney

STEAK

Littlefield finally got things
going theirway as they burned the
nets for 21 points in the fourth
period and holding Silverton to

Top scorer for the Cats
Richard Rogers with 18 points.

Also in double rings with Rogers
were Rudy Ayala with 15 and
Narva Simmington with 10.

Others scoring for Littlefield
were Kevin Gardner with 9, Ralph
Mendezwith 8, and Layne McKin-no- n

with 2.
Highpoint for the Owls

Vaughn with 18 points.

OZ

MR

STRAWBERRY

18 OZ

"

LB

12.
was

was

o

toc

NEW

We We

Food We Gunn Bros.

On & With $2.50 re

Karla bruisedthe nets
for to pace the Cats and
all scorers. Others in double
figures for the Cats were

with 17 and Buzz Daniels
with Paul Mears and Anita

each scored 4 points to
out the

Whitten highpoint for Olton
with 23.

Pacedby John 22
and 19 the JV boys
bestedthe Olton Mustangs59-2- 7

in round action of the

Smith and David Goen
were in double figures with 14
and 10 points,

Othersaddingto the Cat tally
were Eddie Elms with 5, Fred

with 4, Dennis Jackson
and MarkCoffman eachtossedin a
basket.

Olton was paced by the 9 point
effort of

CANDLE
Answer to the Pet

PET comesto you with
set of operating instructions to
your PET CANDLE to sit up,
light up, and fly.

in Small, and Large Sizes.

PET CANDLE
110 Giralda Ave., Coral Gables. Florida 33134

Small S1.00 plus 50c postage &

Medium plus 75c postage &

Large S3.00 plus 95c postage &

Name

Address

City

close

S2.00

State Zip

1976 Pet Candle Inc

BLACK LABEL LB $' C iRU-I- v

COUNTRY STYLE LB $9 SfljSP
12 OZ 57 Jj5 s 1

12 OZ PACKAGE 79'J
79' Z&

OLEO LB QUARTERS

SHURFINEAnillf 12

UKANUE JUIV.C frozen
PILLSBURY

BREAD MIX OZ

COFFEE

COFFEE 100 count

FOIL

WASH
PRESTONE

gallon

KEdElm

Thursday

Mustangs

Rita

first

also

PET

C

APf

39 I P0Jf f
49' i Vofcta J i

79 S "

6 , 32 OZ

37.5 FT ;" 69
1 i

i

VERY DRY OZ

OZ

7,,K
69 lP

MMTfmTWMnnm

ReserveThe Right To Redeem

USDA Double

Stamps

McCanlis
25 points

Robinson

Bryant
scoring.

Shipp's points
rebounds

Lockney
tourney.

Rudolph

Martinez

Landrum.

Rock.

train
stand,
Available Medium,

handling
handling

C handling

PACKAGE

PACKAGE

BOTTLE CARTON

12

22

iLnyib

Stamps. Stamps.

Tuesday Purchase

11.

was

GIANT SIZE
-- 4tOL(ILB.tOZ.)-

ONLY

Pioneer

11,

8 0Z

$jl9
WIlM IMS CCKJfON

rtici
wiimoui 1 OO

Goooonit at Supermarket Z2al
NlU 1976

Limit Quantities.

Give
Wednesday

Cigarettes.

respectively.

Florida's
CANDLE com-

plete

om.i.wrfe,..

Excluding

llAMllA$lIAii

1

$29

$129

422

"ADAMSEEST

VANIILA

PIONEER SUPERMARKET

69



i I

t

i!

I

ii.

y

I,

a
t

PAGE 8, SECT. 1, THE LEADER-NEWS- , LITTLEFIELD, TEXAS, SUNDAY,

juaic; jutchjhjlo jjitin

Circle Eiuht Souare Dancers
lime electeda new slate of officers
for the next six months, voted to
"host a half-wa- y this
Thursday. Dec. 9, for studentsnow
taking lessons, and approved a
student dunceon Jan. 27th.

Fun, games and dancing will

highlight the Thursday nightspe-

cial. Club memberswill furnish the
and

for somesevensquaresnow taking
lessons. All students and club
members andformer club mom-kt.- s

are invited to attend. There
.will be no charge for the dance.
Regularclub caller Hap Popewill

do the calling.
, Then on Jan. 27. the students
jlan to host a dance for the club
Members. Various chairmen have
been named for the event.

New officers for the first six

monthsof 1977 have been elected
as follows: Clinton and Joyce
tireen. president: Robin and Nan-

cy Davis, vice president: Gary and
Christy Donathan.secretary; Joan
William;, assistantsecretary;
Kenneth and Gloria Jackson, re-

porter, and directors are retiring
president Bill and Wanda McKin-no- n.

and Tro and Tess Gililland.
iind Kddie and Louise Landers.

Job On Small

Storage Will Build

Any Size, Any Where.
Phone 385-61- 44

fjfi,

in
14

A ?
11 ( -- - 1 W '

two specialdances

er

.refreshments entertainment

Comp'ete

Building.

In

O

,

Si-- Rl I I
"-1rn

- iWS

No. 5003, 12 inch
modern toe

PRICE

Reg 95

fc flrs

RegS63

THE

Outuoini: officers are Hill Mc- -

Kinuon, president; Harrell,
vice president; Troy Gililland,
secretary; Louise Landers, as-

sistant secretary;Nilah Rodgers,
reporter; and Raymond Kelton
and Tollett as directors.

Julia K. Hurley
is appointed

Jo health assistant
Mrs. Julia K. Harley has been

appointed as Health Planning As-

sistant of South Plains Health
Systems. Inc.. (SPHS) effective

22.
Hurley will assist J. Mi-

chael Webb. South Plains Health
systems. Inc., director of planning,
in developing a Health Systems

and related functions for Area
II, a ty area including the
counties Bailey. Cochran, Cros-
by. Dickens. Floyd. Garza, Hale.
Hockley. King, Lamb. Lubbock.
Lynn, Motley, Terry and Yoakum.

Initially, she will be working
area agencies to coordinate

activities in regard to health
systemsplan development.

HEALTHY BABIES
Alcoholic mothers run a sub-

stantially higher chance of giving
birth to a child birth defects,
according to the Mnrch of Dimes.
Early, regular prenatal and
good personal health habits im-

prove a woman's chances of hav-

ing a healthy baby.

PHOTOGRAPHERWILL BE
IXKOUNTRYBOY

WED.. DEC. 8th
10 A.M. TILL 8 P.M.

PACKAGE CONTAINING

10 Wallets
x7 n Color All For Only f128B

See Advertisement Store For More Details

A

LITTLEFIELD
508 Hall Avenue
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"wwu
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N0C0NA
BOOTS

Vamp, camel lancer
round

SALE

2235 GEIO'S

Pete

Nov.
Mrs.

Plan

with

with

JEANS
SADDLEMAN DENIM

CI'C CUDikii rr cit- Y ' u,,mM,x 'm 95

BLUE LEVI'S BELL BOTTOMS

BLUE LEVI'S BIG BELLS

LEVI'S DENIM JACKETS $1449

Check Our New Line

bootscKMG

cowboy
dressboots

SC5

of:

Reg. Priced from S10.90

PRICE

to
top

5003
L

No 5002 Vamp, whiskey veal, 12 inc'i top
modern round toe

95 SALE

Tom

care,
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. .
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Vices Good

y7:Mm
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Off

WESTERN
SHIRTS

$980

SENSIBLE PRACTICAL

DECEMBER 5, 1976

Red.

SALE

FOR

NARVA SIMINGTON goes up for
two points against Anton. The

AMHERST NEWS
MRS. LESTER LA GRANGE

246-333-6

MR. AND MRS. George Har-
mon areat Kingland, on LBJ Lake
for a few days.

MR. AND MRS. Lamar Kelly,
Kathy and Mark went to Hinton,
Okla. Wednesdayof last week with

AM
Bjnk Amenurd U

Matter Chwoa l

At GoodAs Cth
" CESO'S

Reij.S12.90 SPECIAL

$1088
S11.75 SPECIAL

$1088
SPECIAL

$1188
SPECIAL

Reg.S14.95 Jgg

v.

? y- -

y, .. ,rv.T.
fl.m-0-

V-'- .

v:
V

r
to S12.99

$1170

Thru Sat. Dec. 11

PEOPLE

Reg. $15.95 SPECIAL

JEAN

I THE SENSIBLE STORE FOR PRACTICAL PEOPLE
13 GREAT LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU!

PUINVIEW, TX BROWNFIUD, TX HILLSBORO. TX.

irrruFiuo, tx amarilio, tx. dalhart. tx.
McKINNEY. TX LAMCSA. TX. LEVUUHD. TX

LUBBOCK. TX. HtRCFORO, TX INNIS. TX.

CLOVIS, N.M.

OPEN ALL DAY SATURDAY THRU CHRISTMAS

PRICE

STORE

Bulldogs gunned down the Cats
Gti-b'- in Tuesday night piny.

Lender-New- s Photo

her parents,and visited later with
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Don
Millirons and other sisters
in OklahomaCity. They met Afton
Kelly. Lamar's brother and Chris-ten- e

Williams for breakfast. They
visited the H. R. Harveys in
Canadian Friday night and re-

turned home Saturday.

1909.0003

or buying
new

ask.
about

Salvation Army

kickoff meeting

slated Tuesday
The kick off meeting of the

Littlufield Snlvnti6n Army Service

Unit's $2,500 fund drive will be

held in the Chapel of the First
Baptist Church 400 E. 6th at 9:30

a.m. on Tuesday, Dec. 7th.
CampaignChairman Rev. Roger

Martin said the workers

are ready to solicit gifts.
"We know that the people of

Littlefield will contribute to this
emergency fund program as they
have so generously in the past,"
Martin said.

Funds will be used for local

emergencyaid to families in need
and to travelers during
the fiscal year. Other Salvation
Army services include sending
boys to summer camp, caring for

nt girls and unwed
families of pri-

sonersand alcoholics, and provid-

ing relief in natural
"We exist to help people who do

not qualify for one reason or
another for help from other
sources,"Lee Behnke, service unit
chairman explained.

LITTLEFIELD
WESLEY Class of

First Methodist Church will have
Christmasdinnerparty Tuesday at

in the home of Air. and Mrs. Bob
Roden.

CIRCLE of First Methodist
Church will meet Wednesday,
Dec. 15 at 10 a.m. in the church
parlor.

MRS. LOIS PHARRIS has been
patient in Littlefield Hospital.
UNITED Methodist Women will

meet in the parlor Monday at 7:30
for their Christmas party.

REV. CARL McMaster has been
patient in Methodist Hospital.
MRS. LYLE BRANDON is

patient in Medical Arts Hospital.
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Victor Electric

C'7 Reg. $319.00

'24900
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6, TYPEWRim
Standard Royal

$165

A&B
SUPPLY

tinWl( ENERGY
mFFICIENT

HOME

LOST HEAT
HIDES AGAI1!

yfXfw

But theEnergyEfficient
Homecutshim off
at thepass!

The Energy Efficient HomecapturesLost Heat.

Lost Heat is heat you pay for that escapesfrom improperly insulated floors,

and walls. It's heat that is wasted becauseof

The Energy Efficient Home capturesLost Heat and keeps it in; your home so

you usethe heatyou pay for.

The total electric Energy Efficient Homesavesenergy . . . savesmoney.

building

home?

E.E.H.

volunteer

stranded

mothers, helping

disasters.
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ii Eta Omegameets
L

Phi Eta Omega Chapterof

S'P11 . jL flnmn nnnm
i,kov. " 7r

Meeting was opened with

ritunl nnu me sccre--K

the roll. The minutes

F
.- -. .Mont rend a letter from

International office welcoming

chapter Bnu".. ......--

Uad similar icuura .uj ..uu

'
.
- crnvn the renorton

bUeuu B- -;- , .

Chapter's accouiu iu.u u,--

rntnmittec reDorted
PL had met and discussed

,0 service project w.u.

hbers. ... .

social committee reporieu
,lans for tne upturning vmi- -

party and discussed meas
the members.It was decided
the party would be held on

r

v

WEIGE chats with guest
tderKathryn Jonesand district
itrnor of Lions 2-- at the ladies

t meetingof the Early Risers
s Club Saturday night. Weige

donnU Qauqkn
TAX SERVICE

410 Xfd. !hitvc

MUtflttd, Dtcai 79339

PHONE 385-47- 81

-s
Ir-- JT I AT

1 i
t.

RentAthepro

cleaner
'V ,,

V

Dec. 11 in the home of Terri Peel.
The meeting was adjourned and

the vice-preside-
nt conducted the

Pledge Training.

Members repeatedthe Closing
Ritual and joined hands for the
Mizpah.

Refreshments were served by
the hostessfor the evening, Lor-ett- a

Benton. Chicken spaghetti,
hot rolls, pickles, and pumpkin pie
were served to members Nancy
Allen, Gina Hartley, Beth Anne
Durham, Lisa Matthews, Cecilia
McCamish, Kathy Moore, Janice
Muller, Terri Peel, Cindy Ratliff
and member advisor Brenda Den-
ton.

The Cultural program was on
thesubject of art and was given by
Cindy Ratliff. The program was a
home decorating party and many
items for decorating the home
were demonstrated.

c&

yti

tea
j?--

A
,.

was chairman of the special din-
ner. Local musicians Weldon and
Grace Findley and their group
provided entertainment.

PEPNEWS
MR. AND MRS. Michael Albus,

Mr. and Mrs. B. J. Bood and son,
Johnny and Mr. and Mrs. Norman
Bollen, all of Hobbs, N.M., at-

tended the Thanksgiving Festival
and visited with Mr. and Mrs.
Albus', mother, Mrs. Evelyn Al-

bus, aiso Ann Albus of Lubbock
and Gail Albus of Levelland on and
during the Thanksgiving holidays.

ChristmasArt Sale

HOME GALLERY Bula

15 OFF ALL PAINTINGS

r. Mr.,.. Till fhrictmns

llik. A,so: Cooper Etchings and Drawings Prices:S2.00up

Call 933-465-9 After 5:00 or Weekends

Cleanyourcarpet
fasterandbetter
with Steamex:
$ 'H?4 6 power jets

W not dirt the

ill

mm&

othermethods
dorrt reacni

ITT

Do it yourself wid savul

Jot action i penetratesto

loosenground-i- dirt andold

shampoo 2 thensucks it out

j to beautify corpot'

Dries ouicWyi

For rental locationnear you

Vogue Cleaners
JU2 tost Tenth

Littlefield, Texas

Le MOYNE GRISSOM, newly-electe- d

managerof the Chamberof
Commerce presentsthe new 1977
C-- membership plnque to C-- C

president-elect-, Richard Wall. The
new plaqueshave beendistributed

$99,549
Septembersalesof SeriesE and

II United States Savings Bonds in
Lamb County, which amounted to
84,621, were reported by County
Bond Chairman JamesT. Lee.

Sales for the nine-mont-h period

wins,
8th,
Littlefield's seventhgradegirls'

basketball team remained unde-
feated as they downed Dimmitt,
26-1- 6, Monday night.

While the seventhgradeteam is
2-- 0 in season play, their sister
teams are now 1- -1 as the eighth
graderswere defeatedby Dimmitt,

the freshman squad
wnsj. eeked out, 30-2- 7, by the
Dimmitt frosh.

In the seventh grade game,
Littlefield held an impressive 12--4

halftime lead before locking in
their secondwin of the season.

Shotgunning the scoring for the
winners were Vicki Tunnell, Shay-l- a

Bridwell, and Toni Richardson
with seven, six and five points
respectively. Lynette Spencer and
Charla Paceeach got four.

Cited for defensive standout?
were Charla Pace, Lynn Jaquess,
Vanesha Schroeder and Renea
Alttnan.

DIMMITT 38, LFD FROSH 27

Littlefield's 8--7 first quarterlead
was nulified in the second stanza
of play as Dimmitt came back and
took an 18-1- 1 halftime lead before
going ahead and icing the win,
38-2- 7.

Michele Phillips swished the
nets for 13 points to pace the
winners, Linda Glover and Becky

Williams each scored six and
Alvina Gonzaleshit two.

Miss Anthony and Miss Salinas
scored 14 and 13 points respect-
ively.

Cindy Klein, JeanetteJohnson
and Arlene Williams got the nod
for pacing the defense.

DIMMITT 30, LFD Frosh 27
Littlefield's fourth quarter rally

attemptwas a bit too late as they
came within four points of dump-
ing Dimmitt, Monday night.

Bridgette Twitty sparkplugged
Littlefield by bucketing 19 points.
Jamie Lee hit six and Tisha
Martinez two.

Miss Truelock hit 18 for the
winners.

The frosh defensewas headed
by SandraHealy, LaVonnaSander-
son, Gloria Brockington and Dar-len- e

Williams.
Monday, the 7th, 8th and fresh-

man girls travel to Muleshoe for
more basketball action.

I Found
It At

Pazaz!
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Bonds salesreach mark

7th
9th lose

to most members in the city, and
the design allows the renewing of
thedateeachyear, by slipping out
the old and replacing it with the
new. (Staff Photo)

totaled S99.549for 59 of the 1976
sales goal of $170,000.

'Texas sales during the month
amounted to $21,049,995, while
sales for the first nine months of
1976 totaled $198,746,369 with
73 of the yearly sales goal of
S272.4 million achieved.

Chaptermeets
for program
businesssession

The Xi Nu Nu Chapterof Beta
Sigma Phi met in the home of
Loretta Winfield.

A memorandum from City Man-

agerGreg Ingham, asking for. the
names of eight people toVbe
considered for the Board ofebity
Development, was read.The chap-
ter submittedeight names.

Nancy Archer won the door
prize.

Members discussedvarious
points of businessincluding the
Swine Flu Clinic to be held Dec. 11

from 12 to 5. Members helping
with the clinic will attend an
orientation meeting Monday, Dec.
6 at 7.

Members enjoyed a delightful
and informative program pre-

sented by guest speakerDonna
Brown of Home Interiors. Doris
Simpson and Kay Pace were in
charge of the program for the
meeting. Hostesses were Loretta
Winfield and Judy Vaughn.

Members attendingthe meeting
were Ann Manning, Marilyn Park-

er, Edith Birkelbach, Doris Simp-

son, Judy Vaughn, Mary Knox,
Nancy Archer, Jane Ann Byers,

' Sheila Hanlin, Kay Pace, Paula
Schroeder, Janice Sebring, Cindy
Walker, and Carolyn West.

The Greeks were the first
people to pursuemathematics
as an art for its own sake.

With

Day
it,,.

Anton StudentCouncil

supportingSCOREprogram
ANTO- N- In promotion of the

TexasAssociatonof StudentCoun-

cils stateproject, SCORE, on the
elimination of birth defects, a
junior-senio-r high school student
body meeting was held Monday
morning.

Nel Loper, executive director of
Metro Lubbock Chapter, March of
Dimes, showed a film strip titled
"Tomorrow Happens Today."
This filmstrip alertsyoung people
to the responsibility toe giving
future children a healthy start in
life.

Statistics showthat each year
200,000 babies are born with a
significant birth defect. The film-stri- p

explores potential damage
which can be caused by V. D.,
drugs, cigarettes, rubella, and
poor nutrition and challenges fu-

tureparentsto protect the environ-
ment in which life begins.

A short question and answer
session was held with the young
ladies, and a filmstrip, "Inside My

Annual Christmassuit drive
now underway Boys Ranch

The annual drive to provide the
350 boys at Cal Farley's Boys
Ranch with a new suit or clothing
packagebegan today.

Whitharral HD Club
meetsfor business

WHITHARRA- L- The Home
Demonstration Club met Tuesday,
Nov. 16th, in the home of Vera
Rodgers.

Lillie Thetford, president, had
charge of the meeting.

Opal Mixon read a poem "The
end of the road, is but a bend in
the road."

Roll call was answered with
"What has meantthe most to me
in this year'sprogram".

Linda Pitman, county extension
agent,had charge of the program
on "Widowhood".

The next meeting will be Dec.
7th at Lillie Thetford 's It
will be a Christmas luncheon and
gift exchange.

Cakeand coffee were served to:
Marcy Clevenger, Lillie Thetford,
Opal Mixon, Alma Kilgore, Iva
Pair and a visitor, Willie Bryant.

IOIC

Saving Is GreatAt State
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at

home.

Mom," was shown. Nutrition ap-

proachedas a basic elementof life
is the theme of this entertaining
and informative cartoon.

A pamphlet,DATA, was distri-
buted to the students.

A film was presentedby Janice
Hassell, from Blood Services Lub-

bock promoting the blood drive
held December 1. This part of the
program the need
for young people (17 and up)
and adultsto give blood, which is a
life-savi- material for which there
is no substitute.Eachpint of blood
given will help threepersons.

The Blood Services, Lubbock,
serves a ty area with 38
hospitals. Sixty-fiv- e pints of blood
are used eachday in this areaand
there is a shortage. The goal set
for Anton was 100 pints of blood.
When a person is a blood donor,
this gift protects his family for six
months.

The two programs were health
and safety programs for the Stu-
dentCouncil.

'1
m if

Providing new clothing for the
boys through the Christmas Suit
Fund hasbecomea favorite way of
Christmas giving for friends of thq
boys who contribute $35 for hte
purpose. Special discounts by
Amarillo merchants and diffeTJ
ences in prices of clothing tor
younger and older boys make the
average cost of $35 possible.

The suits replacethose that have
been worn out or outgrown, and in
many cases,they are the first new
suits some boys have ever owned?

"The boys get to select their
own clothing in Amarillo stores,'
and the suits will be worn by
graduatingseniors next spring.".

Virgil Patterson.Ranch Presi-
dent,said, "A new suit is the best
Christmas present a boy can
receive becauseJLis a year-roun- d

reminder 'of those who reallv
care" S

Contributions to the Boys Ranch
Christmas Suit Fund may be
mailed to the Boys Ranch Office.
P. O. Box 1890, Amarillo. Texas
79174, or taken to the office at 600
West 11th Street in Amarillo.

S

385-370-4

4

TRIED THE REST, NOW TRY THE BEST!

JIM'S PLUmiUG CO.

PLUMBING, HEATING AND AIR CONDITIONING

24 HOUR SERVICE

LICENSED

385-380-8

PAY YOURSELFFIRST

Automatic SavingsPlan

In To Day Interest

CompoundedDaily

SEESaJE

masins

Security

emphasized

BONDED

YOU'VE

Our

Out
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Ereft
NEWS AND ADS DEADLINE

TuesdayNoon
For Thursday'sEdition.

Friday Noon
For Sunday'sEdition.

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING
RATES

11 CentsPer Word-1st- .

Insertion-Sl.6- 5 Minimum
9 CentsPer Word-2n- d

Insertion-S1.3-5 Minimum

CLASSIFIED DISPLAY
AD RATES

S2.00 Per Column Inch
(First Insertion

And S1.60 Per ColumnInch
For Additional Insertions

CARDS OF THANKS
ITime

Maximum Of 20 Words, SI.65
Over20 Words Are Charged
At RegularClassifiedRates

ItETiTEFI

CARPENTER work. Painting,
panelling, roofing, general repair.
3S5-433- 6. 1121 W. 10th. TF-- R

WANT TO buy junked cars, scrap
I iron, metal batteries.Will pick up.
J Lamb Salvage.Ray Franklin, own

er, 905 W. Delano, phone 385-550- 5,

nights, 385-615- 6. TF-- F

'WILL BUY, sell, trade or rent
utility trailers. Phone 385-359- 0.

Tf--N

For Classifieds
Dial 385-44-81

NURSES AID 7-- 3 and 1. Apply
in person, Knight's Rest Home,

t 520 Ash. TF-- K

Help wanted for year round
employeesin cotton industry.
No experienceneeded. Apply
at Texas Employment Com-

mission. 1212 Houston St.
Levelland, Texas. Equal Op-

portunity Employer.

Challenge
Yourself

Today's Army is looking for
young men and women,
17-3- 4. who want a challenging
job with a future. We'll pay
S417 a month to those who
quaify for one of these:

JOBS OPENINGS
Missile Crewmen 28
DieselMechanics 55
Artillery Crewmen 106

Broadcasters 12
CombatEngineers 98
Muscians 16

Infantrymen 264
Tow truck Operators 19
Cooks 81

Armor Crewmen 161

Surveillance 37
Ask your local Army recrui-

ter about enlisting now or
reserving a job for up to 365
days.

ACCEPT THECHALLENGE
CALL COLLECT

SSG JIM DE LA GARZA
(806) 296-922-8

SUNDAY. Electrical appliances,
games, furniture, and muchmore.
1301 W. 13th. 12-5-- N

IMtV.Ml
TRY THE extra strength-- Grape-
fruit Diet plan with Diadax-Reduc- e

excessfluids with Fluidex, Rodens
Drug. 12-2-- R

BEAUTY BY MARY KAY

CALL FREDDIE DUKE

1318 W. 14th. 385-506- 4

Seek Ads Work

iHHBHHBHHHK

FOR SALE: good 130 acres, dry-

land farm 1 mile northeast of
Littlefield airport. Call owner for
information, and showing after

k

5:30 p.m., 385-337- 3. TF-- A

FOR SALE: 40 acres-irrigate- d

farm, has underground tilo and
large barn. 3 bedroom, 2 baths,
brick home, carpetedthroughout.
Also double garageand schoolbus
and mail route with naturalgas.2
miles southeastof Littlefield. Coll
385-331- 4. TF-- 0

3 LOTS, 1114, 1116 and 1118 E.
15th. Plumbed, water meter,sew-

er line, 40x140. Phone 385-550- 6 or
385-361- 2. TF-- D

CUSTOM MADE DRAPES-- Hun-

dreds of colors and styles. Com-

pare quality and price. C. R.
Anthonys, Littlefield, 385-353- 5.

TF-- A

Good level quarter section,
north of Spade. 29 down,
owner finance balance at 7.

MILLS
REAL ESTATE

109 E. 4th. 385-345- 9.

FLOYD ROmil
REAL ESTATE

178 acres dry land, a good
one. S235.00

178 acres dry land, some
grassand windmill. S210.

156, 2 miles from Amherst, 8
in. well. S425.00

177, 3 miles from Amherst, 8 I
in tl.All nil 1a, nln..l Af . Hi. men, an uuv uuuui w ucres
sowed to wheat and up.
S80.000.00

151.7, Vt mile from Amherst.
2-- 6 inch wells lays good.
S450,00

80 acres, northeast of Am-
herst,good 8 in. well. $550.00
per acre.

Box 428
Amherst, Texas 79312

PhoneOffice
Res. 246-364- 8

No Answer 246-331-0

3 bedroom, brick, 2 bath,
carpeted, fenced yard.

3 bedroom stucco, 2 baths.

3 bedroom, carport.

4 bedroom, stucco, 2 baths.

2 bedroom, stucco.
2 bedroom, 2 baths,close to
town.

12 acreson loop.

We havesold for others, let us
sell for you. We need your
listings.
Equal Housing Opportunity

Otis Bennett

Real Estate

385-42- 15 385-357- 5

509 Phelps
3 bedroom, 2 bath, formal
living room, kitchen and din-

ing area together,large base-
ment with 2 bedrooms, living
area with fireplace, 2 car
garage,Crescent Park.

One of the nicer homes in
Littlefield. This onehasevery-
thing you have always wanted
in a home. 23rd St. $89,500.

We have severalnew homes,
some under construction,
some completed and ready to
move into, $25,500to $46,500.

3 bedroom, 1 bath, carpeted,
1 car garage, storm cellar.
Nice home. $12,000.

3 bedroom, 1 bath, central
heat.Nice home. $15,800.

Equal Housing

3 X 50 FT. businesslots with 3

metal warehouses for sale. 385-467- 4.

TF-- S

5 ACRESoutside city limits. Good
irrigation well, barn, garage,385-566- 7.

12-9-- G

Irrigated, 110 acres, E. of
Amherst.

324 Acres NW of Spade.

240 acres S. of Hart Camp.

160 acres E. of Hart Camp.

80 acres N. of Hart Camp.

3 bedroom, 1 bath, carpeted,
916 W. 4th.

G.D. Harlan
Real Estate

103 E. 4th.

Bus. 385-426- 5 Res. 262-427- 0

Large, 2 bedroom, 1 bath,
attached garage. Priced to
sell. 816 E. 7th.

2 bedroom, brick veneer, 1 lA

bath, den and living room,
attached garage.702 E. 8th.

3 bedroom, 1 bath, central
heat,large patio. Fencedback
yard. 1205 W. 4th.

Want to sell your home call
us first. We needyour listing.

3 BEDROOM, 1 bath, central
heat, refrigerated air. Well
located in Sudan Priced to
sell.

Curtis Chishoim
Real Estate

Office 385-601- 7 Home 385-342- 5

Claude Burnett 385-510- 2

Home 385-398- 9

Announcing

Mrs. Carol Brooks is asso
datedwith Wingo Real Estate
as a saleslady. Mrs. Brooks
will be glad to assist you in
selling and locating.
We have 2 and 3 bedroom
homes.
Farmsin Lamb and Bailey Co.
List Your Property With Us.

INGO--1 Estate '
143 N. Westside Ave.rr

Mildred Wingo 385-468- 4 I 4
I Carol Brooks 385-519- 4 H"3

Equal Housing Opportunity

385-329- 3

189acres, 5 wells, 3 bedroom,
2 bath, living room, den,
basement,2 car garage, south
of Amherst. $550 acre.

Three storage buildings on
150x140 ft. lot. Close to
downtown. $25,000.

3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick, two
car garage, large shop. Nice
landscaping one acre. Bula
Hwy.

When buying or selling pro-
perty call us.

Gilbert Lemons 385-362- 2

SandraRichards 385-571- 9

Robert Richards 385-571- 9

Jackie Foley 385-588- 1

Equal Housing Opportunity

Opportunity

ROBERT RICHARDS REAL ESTATE

VBHBHEHBHiiiHHfelbiBkKXMSivHBHHHM

SUPERinvestment and buy, three
bedrooms, basement, fireplace,

two baths, two car garage, huge

storage room, large kitchen, large

formal dining room, large den, and

tenniscourt. Call 385-442- 1. After 7

p.m. 262-445- 2.
TF-- D

LARGE HOUSE with barn and 5

acres inside of city limits. 1521 W.

9th. or call 385-348- 0. TF-- L

3 BEDROOM, 2 full baths,electric

kitchen, carpeted, fenced back

yard. 1237 W. 14th or call 385-608- 0.

TFT

TWO BEDROOM, 1 bath, new

paint inside and out. Wall heater,
new carpetand panelling through-

out. Wired for stove, washer and

dryer. 385-340- 4 or 385-488- 3. TF-- L

3 BEDROOM, 2 baths, with at-

tached garage, in Amherst. To

settleestate.Call 285-222- 0. 12-12- -a

ALL BRICK, 3 bedroom, 2 baths,
fireplace, immediate possession.
1301 W. 13th. 385-545- 3. TF-- N

FOR SALE in Sudan. Nice 2

bedroom house, garage, large
storage house. 202 Austin, 227-211- 8.

12-16-

12x65 TRAILER HOUSE, VA

bath, partially furnished. Call from
8-- 5. 272-436- 2. After 5, 272-436- 2.

C

HouseFor Sale
For saleby owner, 3 bedroom,
2 bath, brick, like new home.
4 mo. old. 227 E. 26th. Buy
equity, take up payments on
large established loan. 385-319- 2.

TF-- G

riTiTsfrarenn
NEW SMALL bachelor apartment.
Appointment only. Phone 385-451-

0.

lZ-5--

For Rent: Mobile home
Spaces. SunsetSlope Mobile

'Home Park. 100 N. Sunset --

Littlefield Laundry, storm
cellar, paved streets,parking
pads, lighted streets, quiet
neighborhood. Call 385-368-3

or 385-398- 3 nights.

'H
J,- - 'J?

.. :. . si -- '

nrt W

andair
Swimming

385-374-2

&qri

TMbtMimrw

YOUR NEIGHBORS tradeat State
Line Irrigation for all their irriga-

tion needs.Why not you? Little-

field, Levelland, Muleshoe. TF-- S

14' MILLER Offset disc. 2 row
service shredder. 6 row R&J rod
weeder. 6 row bed roller. 2 bottom
Case moleboard. 1962 Chevy Vt

ton pickup. 1964 Ford 951 butane
tractor. 233-- 2 1 3 1 Spade. 1

PVC PIPE and fittings. Vi" thru
10". State Line Irrigation. Level-lan- d,

Littlefield, and Muleshoe. TF

1975 KT 250 motorcycle, like new.
Nice 3 rail trailer with tool boxes
andstoragecompartment.$800 for
both 416 E. 13th. TF-M- c

250 SUZUKI streetbike. 385-605-1.

12-5-- B

1973 BMW, R-5- 0. 8,500 miles.
Wixom Fairing, bags, and back
box. $2,250. 385-446-9. W

1969 PONTIAC Catalina, loaded.
White over maroon. A good car.
See at 13th and Harrell, $750.
385-302- 4. TF-- G

1975 DELTA Royale, 2 door, vinyl
roof, power seats,windows, locks,
amfm stereo, extra clean. 385-605-1.

12-5-- B

LITTLEFIELD Self Storage, Vt

mile east of Littlefield on Spade
Hwy. 24 hour self service, you
keep key-nig- ht lights, economical
personal and commercial storage,
individual storage7 X 12 to 10 X

24. Household goods, merchan-
dise, boats, campers, tools. Call
385-45- 33 or come by Littlefield
Delinting Co.

TAXI SERVICE

7 A.M. - 7 P.M.

ran
FULL BLOODED Dobermans.
Male S50, female $40. 385-383-3

after5 p.m. TF-- H

v '
rtT PWi. Jlllllllllliiiiii iiii7r7T,V-- -;in nil iiiniriH i.i i H..rn;HWHrm pjmrni . mn u ' : wkjui.' h t m ft rr

,

N ' AV .

Frost-fre- e

Dishwasher

Disposal

Shag

controlled heating

conditioning
Pool

.

385-501-1

2 .

' " I

11 Texas

for M
lion size. See them at' 1Knwnanlrl TOE on.,.

""" uoo-o- y,

BEAUTY SHOP equipmenl
sale. 233-275- 1.

GOOD used
and white. SomnnnwLi. .

field Service Center. liuuiunu. ooo-iUT- i,

GOOD used nnnlinn. t..
See at Littlefield Service Ci

iouu c. uelano.385-342-

WHOLE FRESHmilk

and Sat. Cow are T n j
per gal., 95 cen

"t gai. White's Dairy S

Texas79371, St. Rt. Box 6,'

Gift items and lots of jeweli

uumu Dy and register
Cadillac radio and man--t

diamondneckln i,

away Eve. Clari

ueuuiy anop, 1216 Montin

Ave. JB0-4e-4.

BaI KttBtmh

NEW LOW RATES

For the Under 40 group on

Blue Cross Blue Shield

Health Ins.

For more Information!

Contact:
ClaudeA. Burnett, Jr

514 PhelpsAe.
385-510- 2

Littlefield, Tex. 793

C

Heating Condiiioninj

Sheet Metal Work

Complete stock of repaJ

parts for all major lines c

plumbing, heating
conditioning products.

Service on all major line

hciling and

tioning Equipment.Sales

Service Installation.
Bus. Phone 385-502-

1022 E. 9th

Littlefield's
Luxurious! -

wn.'-.-v

JBSF
wiiiiir

iveil

Air

Come to the world of carefreeapartment living in Llttlefield's newest addition-O- ak Terrace

Apartments.Select one of our spaciousone or two bedroom designs, tastefully furnished or un

furnished,all with the contemporaryconvenienceof all electric G.E. appliances.Every room in

your new apartmentwill blend beautifully together with your choice of four coordinated color

schemes-ru-st, electricblue,green, or brown.

refrigerator

Range

carpet

Individually

lh &

'i

Freecolor cableTV

Large walk-I- n bedroomclosets

Tile entry

Drapes

Laundry Facilities

Electric BarbecueGrills on Grounds

Individual Assigned Parking

Floor 3Sb.m3

Wicker Littlefield,

TRAMPOLINES

T.V.'s.colorand

tested.S1.85

Christmas

i'JThiJ

CAMPBELL'S
PLUMBING

M,

Most

jt$piV
Wrrw OakTerrace

CheckTheseFeatures:

Plans!

OakTerrace

m
O ! fta"

Telephone385-338- 2

mmmmmmmmg



MORE SEEK ADS

LvTiNG (inside andout). Pnper
P ..odVnl rnillni'fl nntl
tr,pngVoos. N. C. Tubbs,

,
11,385-w'1-

-

.,iXY Ceramic tile. New or

miA Free estimates. 385- -

L.TR STOPPED UP? Let us
I"tn . ., lino with nnr

fQrvir.HarrellBuild- -

"supply, Anton. 997-362- 1. TF-- H

MMIE GRAY roofing, pointing,
au worKguur-S.C81I385-606-8.

TF-- G

ELDING - 24-ho- service, by

0r contract, rree eauimiiea.
Mike Daw, 601 b. 5tn, or

U TF-- N

I iff SHARPENING, skill, chain

P ww1 909 E. lGth.a. "flies , w
4348.

UNT your rooms for the "Holly

ae" TrU-le- oupreim: nave

i.,. sin Now $8.97 Gul.!
Lelustre Latex Semi-Glos- s

$12.98) urn,
llson True Value narawaru
lor;.

inow 9v.vi

EWAX RUG SHAMPOOER for

oer day. Harrell Building
Lpply, Anton.

CONVALESCENT equip--

laitatBrittain fnarmacy. vvneei
fiirs, crutches, hospital beds,
ier items. Complete line conval--

int needs. TF-- B

BE BUILD concretecellars and
laments. H. G. Ferguson, 385--

Storm Sheltersand all kinds of
concrete work. Phone 385-614-4.

Rosales Concrete.

Industrial
BEARING & BELTS

Forney Welders
& Supplies
Farm Equip.

G&C
AUTO SUPPLY

"00 E. 14th.

UTTLEFIELD ROOFING

ROOFING

TF-- H

-F

385-443- 1

All types built-u-p asphalt
mofs. Composition shingles.
Anork guaranteed.Call Ron
Foshee. 385-568- 0. Littlefield.
Tex.

1

EVERY WEDNESDAY NIGHT

IS SPAGHETTI NIGHT

Save 50' $19

m

l 'nTHfwrMM

"Dy-Couh- tij

BAVINSSIAND LOAM

Conventional Loans
Home Impr. Loans
Installment Loans

Littlefield Office

7th And X1T

Ph. 385-514- 9

Now is the time to start on a
fertilizer program for the 1977
season.Checkon

GRACE SLURRY
MIX

For a complete fertilizer
program you can afford. Call

FARMERS
FERTILIZER

233-213- 1,

Spade,Tex., day or night.tf--m

BARGAINS
Groceries by the case
Clothing for the entire fam-

ily
Glassware& other houseware
items.

Stop in and saveat the

OUTLET

303 Main Anton, Tex.
Open 10 a.m. - 5 p.m. on
Tues. to Thurs.
10 a.m. 6 p.m. on Fri. and
Sat.

ATTENTION HUNTERS
AND TRAPPERS

Fur buyer will be in Little-fiel- d

at Crescent Shamrock
eachMonday from 12:00 a.m.
till 12:30 a.m.beginning Nov.
29th.

We buy green and dry furs
of all kinds. Skin case all fur
(like oppossums),not open up
the middle. We also buy deer
hides! Well handled furs
bring TOP PRICES!

Northwestern Fur Co.
ColoradoCity, Texas

NOW OPEN

The Thrift Shop

Used furniture, appliancesfor
every room. Wall decorations,
dishes, etc.

222 f. 73th.

Pizzainn.
38S4S08

LHall Ave. Sedell Black, Owner 385-52- 42

AcolorTVXMAS!
tUSJP

Make this theyear!

SIC Credit Company
420 PhelpsAvenue 385-44-92

S

HEAVY, HEAVY hangsover your
head! Or it did Friday when a
special crane lift was brought to
Littlefield to place several air
conditioning units on top of the
newportion of First National Bank.

AMHERST NEWS
MR. AND MRS. Sam Harmon

are visiting her relatives in Cali-

fornia.
MR. AND MRS. W. F. (Bill)

Taylor's grandson, Kenneth C.

Taylor, a 1973 graduateof Mule-sho-e

High School, sonof Mr. and
Mrs. Bill Taylor Jr. of Muleshoe
hasbeennamedto "Who's Who in

American Universities and Co-

lleges". He is majoring in Business
Administration and Physical edu-

cation at Howard Payne Univer-

sity. The criteria for Who'sWho in
American Colleges and Univer-

sities is senior status, distin-

guished extracurricular activities
and scholastic achievements.

MRS. MARY E. BRITT, Mrs.
Nolan Harlan and John of Bula,

LEADER-NEW- L1TTLEF1ELD, TEXAS, DECEMBER SECT. 1, PAGE

Workers faced power lines as the
main obstacle of the project, and
finally, the had to be moved
to the front of the building to
complete the job. Staff Photo

Mr. and Mrs. RodneyMarshal and
Melanie of Whitharral were with
Mr. and Mrs. Britt Loving-to- n

for Thanksgiving. Mr. and
Mrs. Roger Britt and Mrs. Adele
Cole of Lovington met them there
for the day.

I Found
It At

razazl

, LITTLEFIELD 5

j 508 Hall Avenue SHjWJ
AlCoodAlCWi I T

CR RADIOS PRICES GOOD THRU IVs SAT., DEC. 11th G
"

Millilinannn T 23 ChinneltMobile all crystals included Built-i- Mike Praamp M
v ffFf ff "1"I ff K"f Automatic Modulation Control Illuminated Channel Selector Y

V Operates with positive or negative Ground A
-- " with mike, holder and mobilebracket I I

MoaMMBJBBBBw Model No V

PSi Reg.S99.95 U

""

JiurangeH 0

23 Channtli Mobile, all crystals supplied Continuous Delta Tune II
Illuminated Chennel Selectorwltn P.A Illuminated SRF Meter Y
External Specker Jack Automatic Noise Llmiter wSwitch pjpjpjBJMpjMB I
Built-i- Mike Preamp Built-i- AutomaticModulation Control BBBBBBBBBBBBBBJn
Operates Positive Negative Oround Plug in Microphone pPPPPPPPPHU
Model no 7iA .iBBBBBBBBBBBBBjT
Reg. $124.95 jK)special nv BEEHBRIWI

I JOHNSON VpCbOJLm I

' 'MittttHVMM0lHBipE99k Y

. JPPPK L.K' SKmCr IaWn 1

ppjLppHppS p ciiioimmI f

s Limited Quantity TRANfCIIVM A

MESSENGER 123A Mod.lOTX23andOTX3M3 Y
Th mott POPuUf CBrdl to Arntnej jow mlt orfUIOrd Audio ' ' J uV. tfl

t nd Acouttiuity lMUt4 ipktr lytitm for Httf n.tutialHnolit V ex? irM JA 100 chaitti iio buiit-t- Itettook tochconprt y
iion,mcPniclittltty IHttf autom(c noiw limiting and n iiPMPpjflflHplHBi, IControll HI Uiumlnaltd mtttrln aivi rtUtlvt trtntmitttf Output wd tppppppppipm A

:

s

;

1 1

or

rutlvtd nai nucttfi nfltn9i. Mt.Mnr 121A tn ) crannal Hk II
mooiit witrt Jortnionpfrtormanc ff Mlubilily . popularpnett PJWe y

AM

SPECIAL $11995 HSifVoQ' 0

.iiPPBTPBJV ah QQ1111 fl

JJtgmmMmM pacemodel q

ISCHANNIICI
VMAMCSIVIH

dcriii

wmmmMmmm cb 123a a
Total performance and feature packed valuewere designed Into the CB USA
by PACE engineers to achieve new nighs In practical values with eosoiutely no
eitras to buy. Wlin full five watts ot II F power to draw trom, the PACC 123A
relies uponnigh parformance circuitry with speech compressionto achieve
unsurpassed transmittedeudiaqualltles e dual conversion
receiver assureshigh efficiency noise eliminator that reduces Ignition and
other radiated noises. The PACE IDA Is a leader In the world of CB
communications with public address,speech compressioncircuitry, "on the

transmit ) leceiva watcaiur tn, w an hw sii iMitwi.ta.
I" H K 6Ja"W 7"0 Wl JltJI,

5,

crane

ttturt

$9700
REGULAR 0

OPEN ALL DAY THRU (

SfcOSEB KM'S THE SENSIBLE STORE FOR PRACTICAL

THE SUNDAY, 1976.

Wade

j)

SATURDAY

PEOPLE

EHRISTUtB D

(H.11KCM
6.30 ' Ntwt, Weohtr, Sports
6 4$'SatfdHort
7,00' Dvity'sTlNhouse
7.30 JimmySwogoart
8 00 Dor of DiMartry
8.X Jomi Robmson
9.00 Rti Humbord

10 00 'Orol Roberts
10iX limtg Your Migion
noo ABtrtM-iif- t

11 30 Corner Ted Anmtrong
17 00'NfLfootboll

Doublehooder
S 30 ' WeekendReport
6.00 Wondrfut World

of Disrsty

7i00 Sundoy Mystery Movie
B 30 Big Evcnl

10 00 WeekendWrop-u-

10 X Stcvt Sloanfootball
11 00 ChonncM1 Theatre
12 5 News,Weather Sports

(H. 11KCBB
ft 45

730
7 5$

800
8J5
8 30

900
930

moo
10 30
11 00
M30
1 55

t00
MX
130
100
ICO
400
4 U3

' iX.

' 30
6(1

(.

toou
J

voc

Today in Teiai
ondNewMenco

Weather
Today Show

' NewslrYeother
' Today Show

PeoplePlace
Hollywood Squotet

' Whr. el of Fortune
Stumpers
SO GrandSlom

TheCong Show

' NBC News
' Somerset
' Daysof Our lives
' Ilv Doctors

Another World

' Manui Wtlb M D

' G'een Acres
S -- '.rd&Snn
hi .1
NBC News
CcnmoRepo'

CH. I1KBD
10 ' Sanford& Sor

7 UO little House enProire
a CO ' Monday NipJil ot

the Movies
ir Or" WeekdayWrop-U-

It 30 " Tonitjtit Snow
1 X) tomorrow Show

00 ' News Weather Sports

0

10

00

CH. 1 1 KCBD
Adam 2

Boa Bau Black Sheep
Police Woman

' PoliceStory
' Wekdoy Wrop-u- o

' 'ryvpV
' r .rrow Show
' News Weother oort

Automatic Fme Low
ccnsunpiicr Wftite 'mish

Easy roll

95

CH. liKCBB
6 30' Adam 2

til " thePoetic
7 3""

9

"V
1C C 'TowitShow

7 0U 'omsrrowShow
t 00 ' News

6.30 '

7.00

Viow

CH. 11
'Adorn 12
'

8 00 Best Sellers
9 00 Cotton

10

10 30 Ton oht Show

12 00 " Show
1 00 ' News

CH. 11KCBB
6 30 ' Night Before Christmas
7 Vonlmpe

Religious
8 00 (.Its
9 00

10 00 Wisp up
10 30 Ion ght Show

12 00 Show
I 00 News Wnh

CH 11KCBB
6 4. News Sports
7 00 ' WoodoKker

30 Pink

9
9 30 V)und

10 00 'loot of th lost
10 30 'Big John I ttt John
11

11 '

'2 30 f
1 Oft Porter
1 30 Good We
2 00 ' Comer Pyle
2 30 Grondstnnd
3 00 NFl

6
1 00 ' Night at Movies

10 00 'Weekend
10 30 ' N.ght
12 00Nws

TELEVISION

SW1BAY

CM. 13KLIK
7.00 Mhrni the life
7.30 Waldo

8.00
8i30 AmazingGroce

Bible CCkm
900 Ok) Time Hour

10 00 ' Intermediate Sundoy

School letton
10i30foce the Nation
1 1.00' Tom Show

12.00 KfLfootboll
3 00' In ol the Sea
4 00 of lively Arts
S.00 lost of the Wild

5i30 ' All

Come
6 00 60
7 00 ' Sonny & Cher
8 CO KoiaV

9 00
10

10.30 'CBS Night News
10.45 ' Cinema

Chonnel13Nsws

MORNING AFTERHOON-MONBA- Y through FRIDAY

TodoyShow

CH. I3KIBK
6i30 Form & Ranch News

7 00 CBS New

8 00 Coptain Konggroo

9 00 SunstM Solly

9,30 'The Show

10 00 Gombit

10.30 love 0' life
11 00" Young (.

1 1 X Seench for
12 00'Chamic 13 News
12 30 As the Woi Id Tumi

1 30 light
2 00 All m the Family

2i30 Match Gome

3 00 TotlVtolei
3.30 Price Is Right

4.30 '
5

6 00 ' Chonr- -l ' 1 NcS
6 30'MyT'. oons

MONDAY EVENING

CH. 13KLBK
7 Oj ' Rnodu
? 30 Phyllis

8 00 JohnnyCash

t JO ' All i fair
9 "X) ti 'j'.ve Suite

luOO Chrm'i 13 News

"ij3P TB t" Mk

TUESDAY EVENING

CD. J3KIBK
7 00 u - 'wn

' ' V A S M

830'

K.

A' sfr
Sw.'f- -
"- - nl 3N
v 'e V. .

Quasar
19" DELUXE COLOR TV

diagonal CONSOLETTE ENSEMBLE

Insla-Matic-" ColcrTunlng Picture Tube Picture
COM'Ol Stabilized Pownr Kuonlu
Systen Tuning
ene'jy

casters

ServiceMiSer
CHASSIS

$469

385-46-64

Movee"SWtk
MhaCw.'

Wee',oyWrop-u-

Weother Sports

KCBD

VonDyVeondCompony

Industry
Committee

00'WeeVdayWrapup

tomorrow
Weaiher Sports

00Dr
Specml

RocMoid
Serpno
Weekday

tomorrow
Sports

Wrothn
Woody

00'McDuff'olkmgDog
MnnstM

00KK)strnCAPlR
Muggsv

OO'CIhgonMshnci
Juestions

Wogrv
Nashville

football
00lowrenrWrlV

Disney
Report

SolurcViy

Weatlier Sports

'Uncle
HudsonBrothers

Gotpel

londry
11,30'NflTodoy

Conquest
'Festival

Americon
football

Minutes

Oelncchio
00Chonnell3News

Sunday

family

Morning

frVn.no

Restless
Tnmorrov

Guiding

Bonunta
30CB$E.en..tgHws

Of.inJO

CONTEMPORARY
STYLING jM

515 Phelps Ave.

WEBNESBAY EVENWG

CH. UKIBK
2 00 From Jon.ce J M & M

With love
7 00 'Good Times

7 X ' The Jeff ersons
8 00 CBS Wed N.ghtMov,e

10 00 Channel13 News
10 30 CBS lot Movie

Channel13 News

THHRSBAY EVENING

CH. UKIBK
3 30 ' Magazine
TOOMheWoltons
3 00 ' America Salutes

Roy Rodger
10 00 Chomet 13 News
10 30 CBS tote Movie

Channel13 News

FRIBAY EVENtttG
CH. 13 KLBK

7 00 CBS NewsHour

8 00 CBS Friday Nght Movie
10 00Chomell3Nes
10 30 CBS lote Movie

SATURBAY
CH. UKlFiK

6 30 "The Jettons
7 00 Sylvester I Tweely
7 X' Clue Club

BOO Bugsfiivny
RoadRunner

9 00 ' Tu'ron
9 X Shojem-lsi-s

10 X ArV II

II.OO'FntAlrttt
11 JO'NFUodoy
12 00'NFlFoullioll
J no Ntt uVkim ol th Week

3 TO SportsSpec taculor
5 00 'Music Hull America
6 00 ' He How

7 00 'Mary Tyler Moor

3U'BobNwhcii1
BOO Allmlrwjloimly
H Vi'AUit
9 0u Here life Anwr

U (VChonrwIUNewS
UJO'
2W

' Action tlieotet
' Sonimy & Cl
ChomfHaNcws

CH. 28 KMCC
7 X Corioon Cormrol
6 00 Jimmy Swoajart
8 30 ' life is Worth the l..ing
9.00 'Home Show

9 30 New Adventures
of Cilligon

10 00 'OddballCouple
10 30 ' Ammo's Animals

Animals
11,00 'first Baptist Church
17 00 let the B.ble Spr-o-k

12 30 'Issues 4 Answers
1 00 Bridge of love

Methodist Home
1 30SiSePuede
2 X PopGoesthe Country
3 00 ' Ken Collowoy Outdoors
3 30 Ara Porseghion s Sports
4 00 ' Champ Wrestling
5 00 ' Roys of Hope

5 30DorrellRoyolShow
6 00 ' Journey to Ot
8 00 'ABC Sundoy

Night Movie
10 00 '28Sundoy Night Movie
12 30 'ABC WeekendNews

CH. 28 KMCC

7 00 Good Acminq A mpi n n

7 25 Morni'ij win lew
7 30 Good Moimng Ani" cu
8 25 ' Moating with lew
8 30 the Pit Cub

10 30 ' Happy Ojys

'l 00 The D." Ho Shu

11 30 'All My Ch 'din
nOO'TTOSiv)
17 JOMa-ilyFe- ur

1 00 SJ "jPyronfd
30 CW e to li.e

2 lS'Ge'K-o'Hospitj- l

3 OJ ' FA. of Night

3 30 B' K!y Bunch

400 ' luySnow
4 30 P "fig forms
5 00 ABs. tvemnq New
5 T0'An'rGrit,in
6 Ot ' KV r H' i

9 V tie '

CH. 28 KMCt
7 00 Fenther arvl Fo"''
8 00 m Fechnll

II 00'KV(.CNews?8
II 25'PaulHjney
t' T MaryHart'wn
'Ji

liMbLulH

PAT'S RECORD CENTER

CH. 28 KMCC
' 'If c. .

'
S- -' V ' n '

kfCSe N
- v.

iin

IbmI

W

CH. 28 KMCC
7 00 ' Christmas Fontosy

In Disneyland
8 00 Baretta
9 00 Charlie s Ange.s

10 CO ' KMCC News
10 25 Paul Harvey
10 35'MoivHnrtmoi
11 OS Rook HMys'ynl

h Week

CH. 28 KMCC

'00 'Wo "iBuikk. .

"30 'Bo.', Miller

8 00 ' Tony Randall
8 30 NancyWalker
9 00 Sis otSonfroncittri

10 U) ' KMCC Ntws 28

"0 "S ' Paul Harvey

ii (i Woty Hvtmcm
05 Sis el SanFranc iS'u

Dan August

CH. 28 KMCC
00 Ru.'Moris Shinty

N w Teor
8 00 ABC Friday Nght Mo.it

10 00 ' KMCC News J8
10 ?5 Piiul Horvey'
t 1 'A. i Hartffloi.
1 01'SWAt
IJ'rt'PIlClub

CH. 18 KMCC
7(1)' loml Mry Giotw Ape

b 00 ' Hup- - Iheotre
8 30'5c(KhynuoDynoMul
V 30 ' Krolft Super Show

lu 30 Sii InenHs
( 00 Jr Alinsl Anythinq

Goes
IX' Amwiutii rVindsllMt

12 VI' NCAAlMlb-l- f

t, Skilt4 Vokonjes
(U ' WidfW itdctl Sports

5 W PAF

t It) ' Sprue IV99

O'
1 10 Wfot mippening
Sift NFl Fbxlp"
I til ' BiflVulley

'. it)' rt &' M...t
4C ABf A'ceknlN
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ittH
Bfflfl"

.We reservethe right
(TO LIMIT QUANTITIES.

Hrriw
WashingtonExtra

BANANAS
ORANGES
AVOCADOS

COCA COLA

CORN
PEAS

FAMILY

CHERRIESE;,v.i,..3y

Iilb !'''
LOAF JP9

HbHbIbbMbIbbIIHHHbHbIH'''

MILK
HOMOGENIZED

FARM WtffiLlit. ;'
"r

iUAU

BBN

""JSMSiMlHaBafiKf1

CHRISTMAS TREES

4 FT.

10IN.WITH10UTE5

mmmmagMHaaumummamBlmai

5
1

t's

6

Of

"

- .'M
' ;U a

' yi.

lEoc--S

LB Si

EXTRA,

LB.

DEL MONTE CREAM OR
STYLE GOLDEN

NO. 303 CAN

DEL --4,
SWEET ..t

303-CA-
Nt

FARM PAC

PAC

MB JW

"mm

99

FT.

1

RENNOC PLUSH

PLUSH BOOTSJumbo25" Red
With White Cuff, Each $99

MINIATURE BOOTS
12" Solid Red

With White Cuff,

JUMBO SHOE BOOT
ew-Doz- ens Decoratia PurposeJ

Red$229 White 2M

3
CENTRAL,'
AMERICAN.

NAVEL

M2"

--9
s--

, r.tw
$ira&

&&
ICEIURG,
LB.

ALLPUHPOSE RUSSETS A10l 3 ,, XV
l- - ji y,.,.1

?v -
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4r -'
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,
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.

r

rt

B SBl AAA A
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......
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6PAC
32 OZ.
PLUS DEPOSIT
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MONTE . ., ;r
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NO. '
,

'

i

O

Ea 3
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'

X
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-- -

Hitman .taj

lORNAMENTS
Satin Covered Tree
Balls--2 12" Ass't

Colors
18 Balls

1 2
In Bag

IP'
fH

,!( ,,";

mmttmf

LETTUCE

CELERY

CAKE Mil

T11ttWlVll J3-1

23
POTATO

L $J

18'
nQC

JFOR I

--- . a

M m

---1 IWnrTTTTlB

GREEN BEANS

SWEET

MIXED

JK

20LrteS?
MINIATURE
CHRISTMAS
LIGHT

Bulb 19f

ROUND

F.urr's Prottn
SIRLOIN STEAK PmU,

CLUB

TVBrtMC"nunL

CUBE STEAK

BEEF ROAST

AND

j

i--
-

-

NO, 303

FOOD SLICED '

OR IN
NO. CAN

SETS

35 Crystal Doubfe

20 Lite Crystal t A
Flash Set H

.L;- -
Lb

m.i.j..ritTir-rT-.rfi-

CTEAI .' .r.LMH

n

T

mfdr.

CMT

CA4

CLUBr

2

-

OZ

STEAK

RIB STEAK
LB

CHUCK STEAK

RANCH
STEW

-- ' -- rai

Mil

SU

TUESDAYS

WEDNESDAYS

POTATOES
VEGETABLES

PINEAPPLE CHUNKS,

,?

P

ef,

6

m JA" A Wa, (,
, , , KVti1lafl,'r

GAYLOHfiu'T
HO303
CAN'..,,

.

PROTIN

STEAK

MEAT

.. ' i ..4L .

PrpftnLEv: 4.-...-

,u..::..,,,lr
Ml'

7 ros

DflT DIEC ToP

" .1-

PUMPKIN

Shrimp Chicken

'.;

FOOOCiUI
NO. 303

TQ'

a aA -

0

!

FURR'S

.LARGE END

FMRR'S Hfl
ftONKiftt

DI7
Pepperoni Sausage

'Nrivw

CUKS,

69

DRINKS

IkftVCtwlMM
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FURR'S Mtfjir.. fV
END CUT.. :.;&.S ClAL

W -- I1 "Oft1-- "

M!f.T

imB;
M,aaatin?13

?jyWBBwAg
i

.ow jkkms- -
ji , . ;3 "SW &&ij,.vi .

mKr T.w wp

JiMum

jr'rt'sr,-?-- ' ' 3V(t . V

n- - : ir. k .

"Wfc-

:m,mm
d, i. 1lallaBlllWl lal datli V)

rWBIJOH
j J W' I

vr' ; atw5s:in;,.,u....v. iLi w TaiBiii Ttr n

Protn'.Lb
nHB0HIIBBI.19i?f,KxrrwBBaippiawku

C i g
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12

i- - .1
' "4.J-- I

GROUND' ib CHIBE imI'iiZ

a

Fro5f'
Turkey, 8

DDnrrnn cdeadc

A

ynvvvvhi 8 oz

Or

0z

aanmaii.

Oz

Gc

"J""

Hb. -a m m m m "" ' Na. bbj

"SPECIAL

ev.
I4aSw SPECIAL

..-in'fM-

lm

..

lamK JI
KR'ft K?l

Ji'm&iM?:- o.

Ptx ikrimu

vwn rw.
2

WT LlliU Soutce, Or

CJ It..

BEEF 68 H'

SYRUP

Cheese
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Chicken or

r hftn
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srr--
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JkM ttsb BVLIBbHBBBBbHBk
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'TiBmllV Pok.
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Gay
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EGG ICE PIE
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Top MIX

MVOfS

' a jHH. 34

F I Wfmff''4- -
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3$1
ROLLS CREAM
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LADIES SPORTSWEAR
TQQ tinnn

G, 10.00 KtG. 517.00 MIT

G.S13.00 ?8" REG.S18.00 Ml"
tnao - tntt

IG.S15.00 .'" REG. S19.00 TIZ"
REG. S20.00 13

MISSES DRESSES

5. $32.00. .2199 REG. S46.00 ?29"

Jbt UU
10099 REG.S48.00 .!31"

5,536.00 .$24" REG. S50.00 !33"

I, $38.00. 25" REG. S52.00 !34"
3, $40.00. 26" REG.S54.00 f35"

G.S42.00 .'27 REGo S56.Q0 .37"
G. $44.00 ?2899 REGo S58.00 ?38"

REG. S60.00. $3999

JUNIOR DRESSES

G, $26.00. 16' REG. S32.00. 2199

IG.S28.00 199 REG. S34.00. !22

5,530.00 19" REG. S36.00 .24"

REG. S38.00. '25

DACRON KNIT
60" WIDE

'G, $3.49. HI"
G.54.49 $098
G. S4.98.

5,$5,49 v y $0980. S5.98 n

:G,$6.98.

G.$6.49

,
$449

G.S7.98 $498

:. S8.98 $598

EQ.$9,98 $698

SUEDE
WASHABLE

45" WIDE 36" WIDE

:. 54.98
$098

J' $17.98
:. 518.98 $1398

JUNIOR JEANS
REG. S18.00 11" REGo S22.00.

REG. S20.00 .13" REGo S24.00.

REG. S21.00 .$.13" REGo S25.00.

BRAS
REGo S5.50 .$3" REGo S7.50

REG. S6.00 ?3" REG. S7.95.

REG. S6.50 ?4" REGo S8.95.

14"
15"

MA99

..4"

,5"

CHILDREN'S SPORTSWEAR
3 TO 6x 7 TO 14

REGo S8.00 5" REG, S13.00 .$8"

REGo S8.50 .$5" REG. S14.00 $8"

REG. S10.00 .$6" REG. S15.00 ?9"

REG. S12.-0- lREGo-S16.00:........$.1-

LADIES SHOES
Miss Gillen

REG. S20.00 .12" REG. S35.00 .$22"

REGo S23.00 14" REG S38.00 ?24"
REG. S25.00 ?16" REG. S40.00 $26"

REG. S30.00 19" REG. S45.00 ?29"

REG. SI .98.

REG. S2.49

REG. S2.98,

REG. S3.29
REG. S3.49,

REG. S4.49

REG.S3.49,

All UlPNP

lf"C 1". ..A. -

100 COTTON
65 COTTON & 35 POLYESTER

45" WIDE

50 & 50 KNIT

100 60" WIDE

REG. S4.49
REG. $4.98..

KNITS
COTTON POLYESTER

COTTON

$229

WOVEN GABARDINE
100 POLYESTER

wiuc inio
REG. S5.98
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.!4"

$129
Jim

$149

$198
... JL

$098

$198

$098

ou"

Warn
TODDLER WEAR

REG. S12.00 !7" REG. S15.00 9"
REG, S13.00 .f8" REG. S16.00 flO"

REGo S14.00 .$8" REGo S17.00 .10"

ONE GROUP

BOYS
KNIT SHIRTS & JERSEYS

REG . S3.50 .$229 REG . S6.00 $3"

REG. S5.00 $2" REG. S7.00 ?3"

REG. 54.00 $269

REG, S4.50,

MEN'S
KNIT SHIRTS JERSEYS

MEN'S
PREWASHED JACKETS

TO S28.00.

ONE GROUP

VELVET & VELVETEEN

REG. S5.98,

REG. S7.49,

REG. $4.49.

REG. $4.98
REG. $5.98.

REG. S6.49
REG. $6,98,

REG.

REG. $7.98
EG. $8.49 .

ONE GROUP

&

REG. $12.98.

REG.

$099

REG. S5.00

& RLG. S6.50

RLG. S7.50 ?4"

Of L

36" TO 40" WIDE

POLYESTER
CREPE& DOESKIN

CREPE AND DOESKIN

45" WIDE

WOOLENS
80 WOOL-2-0 NYLON ALL WOOL

56" WIDE

$16.98

GROUP

VALUES

S6.49.

$099

$099

12

$Q98

498

$098
"

$Q98

.449

....449

.$498

$798

1298
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Eft tf

FLEX
ft SAM

tNwnti

P
I pi

fZX
I PRO! llH

SHAMPOO

l win iMvami

JcAtucm"i

oil" '

j

Sc3wgyfJJ

rt??rff

55

WW"
'out .

WO TABLETS

Merest'

I r -

I MdryKw
I JUiciatiikJl

1 Secret

cr?

.

FLEX BY REVLON

16 OZ.,

aw

CONDITIONER
BALSAM & PROTEIN

FLEX BY REVLON

16 OZ

TOOTHPASTE
COLGATE

BABY OIL
JOHNSON

ASCRIPTIN
COUNT

TOOTHPASTE

--f

OZ TUBE

100

CREST

J0OZ

7 OZ TUBE

DEODORANT
SECRET SPRAY

OR 8 OZ

ROSE MILK

V2 OZ

7

7

w TILE

--s

$

59

1

1

39

19

29

59

89

SKIN CARE CREAM

nni ad nAv
UVkkl III; MJl

99

t

"1

IW!

lUHK

m . . tj

Mr H M

LIMITED TO STORE STOCK

HAIR SPRAY

wi$
mima

fatTE

iimci"!

HUM

aim!., RsJ' Sup' Jnctmd Sut'

BRUT
ALL PURPOSE LOTION FABERGE

THE BARON
BY EVYAN

BUB fg-xfi- ii

S1

ify

COLOGNE ATOMIZER

WHITE BY EVYAN 2

SPRAY COLOGNE

MASUMI BY COTY

ATOMIZER SPRAY
CHANEL NO. 5

PERFUME MIST
CHERIE GRASS

ARDEN

DIAMOND-FACE- T

BY REVLON

CACHET
BY PRINCE MATHABELLI

B Hm kodak

QUANTITIES

jfice"id

BY

1

11 OZ

FOR GENTLEMEN

4.5 FLOZ

SHOULDERS

12 OZ

MEMORIE OR BLUE

BY ELIZABETH
0Z

INTIMATE
4

2

2

1

$7

$6

$8

6

8

6

50

00

00

00

pJ

UJLUbNE I

0Z

0Z

3.2 OZ

34 OZ

OZ

bA25

3

00

00

I CHANTILLY r $g50

RODEN ffi DRUG
I PRICES GOOD MONDAY, TUESDAY, WEDNESDAY

STORE HOURS: 8 A.M. TO 7:00 MA. MON. TO SAT. 9 A.M. TO 5:00 P.M, SUNDAY

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES

ItcBbV

! Kodak
wjVTTkJJI

StHXtfp

ft
bain- -

' FOR 1

SKIN

608 CAMERA

OUTFIT

EK6 INSTANT

CAMERA
KODAK

MOVIE CAMERA
KODAK

OVER-DR-

MOVIES WITHOUT LIGHTS

S124.00

SHAMPOO
CLAIROL

SHORT & SASSY

' i'S

jA SHAMPOO

7 0Z

INTENSIVE

BEN

Ben-Ca- y. Gel

j

CONTAC

NEW

XL33

TAKE

REG.

jl

JOHNSON

LOTION
VASELINE

. 10 OZ

CONTAC

L k ' " ,dK
A j',v."i '. cii?a!---- v

INSTAMAJic

$9

$70

$1

BABY

COUNT

9!

89

CARE

GAY

1

79'

1 14 OZ TUBE

10

79

89



BULA NEWS

L.JOHNBLACKMAN

bTro,nlt
1well attendedwith lots

j food to cat.

AND MRS- - Jonn ""nai

.j t,n Hnv visitinc in the
(their daughter, Mr. and

LerDeSautelland boys,

ud Cliff. Also was several

relatives wu.. - -
a,' mother, ivira. y --

j jrhter. Mr. and Mrs.

rker. all from Thomas,Mrs.

jiterson 01 onyuui au .

Jrs. Layton ivnox unu cim- -

tjyson ana oiunyn irum
. ruff mme home with his

jparents and spent until Sun--

iftrnoon.
, ivn MRS. V. C. Weaver

ed having with them Thanks--

day their aaugnier, mrs.
'cm and a eranddaughter

jniy, Mr. and Mrs. Timothy

iinurka ana cnuureii, nuy,
ind Tim, oil from Lubbock.

the noon hour mey
mil from their crand--

Howard andMark Weaver of

orage, AlasKO, ana an en-havi-

a visit over the phone
them.

nvv WAY iunior hieh boys'
- - WiUWM rf

nrls' teams played Bledsoe
1(lay evening on home court,
i on their came by two
a, with Keith Layton

10 puima ujiu giiio uiuuu
tag

by only one point, 20 to
fiette Cox put in 14 points.
3MPANY with the H. M.
Is during Thanksgiving were
an and family. Mr. and Mrs.
:es Goldston and three sons,
i, Mark and Wade from
irillo; also his daughter, Mr.
Mrs. JamesCarroll, Jennifer
James from Abilene, and Mr.
Mrs. Alan Black of Bula.

ll. AND MRS. Gene Bryan
he to Friona for Thanksgiving

spent the day with her sister
Iksband the Otis Neels.
TETTE COX spent the week--

la Plainview with her cousin,
ada Wallace. Her parents,the
.Coxes went after her Sunday

ispent the day with Mrs. Cox's
a and family, Mr. and Mrs.
Wallace and Rhonda.

flL AND MRS. Ed Crume
ve to Temple Wednesday and
:t the Thanksgiving holidays
i a daughter, Miss Diane
ae.Also to be with them was
tier daughter and husband,
naand Danny Smith of Dallas.

10 BE WITH Mr. and Mrs. C.
Cunon for the Thanksgiving
uys were their daughter,Mr.
Wrs.R. E. Martin of Lubbock.
a Beverley Martin, student at
.r law School, Waco, Mrs.
ay lannon, and Timmy of
'i and Janice Cannon, student
lech.

JR. AND MRS. Johnny Hall
3$on, John, and Mr. nnri Mrs
f I Cox and son, Mark of

kw, were guestsThanksgiv--
'foywith their nnrpnto Mr nnrl

fewitt Tiller. Also his'par--
;-
-. ana Mrs. Hoyt Tiller of

e with them.
'AND MRS. Ashel RiVhnrH.

Partedby their son, Mr.
rs. Mike Richardson and

en. Michael and Misty
Fff U'm MrS' JerrV
,l(1'oula. snnntThnni,ar,:,,;

T Lubbock. vio;5 : u
a60I her co .i r !..

SSrry Dixon- -

2?BELLAR Jr. enjoyed his
I " "naay with a birthday

' v "lv omu oi nis
fwnt, Mr. and Mrs. E. C,
17' ai enjoyed charcoal

" -- ' an the trimmings,
Jrthday cake decorated

'Mickey Mouse. To help

ZT' his P d. . ..
.n. "u,ui ir. ana Mrs.

K!?1son'Lartyof Sudan
fe !H

rSl John BelIar of
l"HS. .ininr ...."hi nuuuARD re-no-

Wednesday from
the ti,-i.- .. . . ..

iittk. j "",maBving non--
uaughterand family,

UiiS,'BarneyldfieJdand
Cfaj,tM. quoand Shannon,

K iS-- Nolan Harlan
i! --Z?? Fridy t the

Li -"- VAilsI l'hiir.U ! OI 1

Ks--i-r- "
tolVii. ,UJ' EweU Duties

H6 0f her brother nn,5f"..l

933-232- 8 I

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Estes. All
of their married children and their
families were with them Thanks

MIX&

MATCH

Iru &t je . f iff

I SLIGHT TO& L,
IRREGULARS NSS1

2 FOR S7.00 Mffi
MWW

SIZES iW
8-- 20 Jmml

LARGE SELECTION

Lodict'

&

TIE OXFORDS

The 9fto littl 2 yelr
tie with iupr crepesole.

Several tolori. Siiet:
to 10.

MEN'S

JEANS

2.97

SEVERAL COLORS

REGULAR S14

SIZES 28-- 38

MRS. W. B. SMITH, JR.

BOYS GIRLS

VALUES TO 58.99
SEVERAL

100 COTTON
SOME BLENDS

SIZES 6-- 16

S0FTEE

mm

VISITING during Thanksgiving
holidays with Mr. and Mrs.' Ray

Culwoll were their son-in-la- w and
daughter of Houston, and their

giving day.
MR. AND MRS. J. C. Withrow

enjoyed having all of their children
and grandchildrenwith them for
Thanksgiving, thoy were Mr. and
Mrs. JoePrice andson, Timmy, of
Plains, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Smith
and Steve of Hurst, Mr. and Mrs.
Kennith Johnson of Muleshoe,
Jeff, Jarrod and Karla of the
home, also her mother, Mrs. Lola
Lentz of Littlefield was with them

iWUJNIUMWUL UnttldlHAS --M"n KSI

Ml XLif

dtr

CORDUROY

LADIES

100

POLYESTER

PANTS

&T0PS
VALUES TO S20

JEANS

STYLES

mSw

m

j.

OLTON NEWS

BANKAMERICARD.

vlrfiMmn

SIZES 38-- 44

100

REG.
S26

FOR S35.00

Em
4

(5SS1

Steve, and
Lockney

MR. AND MRS. Daniel
spent

THE
for dinner

GASTON and wife,
Karen and Jodie
drove up and spent

with his
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ho-gar- d.

Also to be with
day Mr. and Mrs. Ray
Kennison and girls, Kim and
Dusty of Olton.

several light heart
attacks A. P. Fred been

...-- ,- ,.r-- ..-- -. t'" 4.'9 iiwm jr.

i n !
.

i

5

..- -.

1

2

"

T l4

Wfm

POLYESTER

MEN'S

LEISUREALS

daughters,
Granbury,

grand-
parents,

Thanksgiving

FOLLOWING

$1988
PolyesterFilled

Reg. 3W

FOR

You'll think you ore sleeping on air when you rest
your head on pillows from Pamela 21" x ticking
stripe covers Remember Anthony's for your Home
Furnishing Needs,

285-238-5

son, coach teacher in
public schools.

Raiford
Sr. Thanksgiving day in

LEADER-NEWS- ,

Thanksgiving
HO Vickie,

from

Thunksgiving

were

has

IS.

27",

'.U.

M-'tsf-
i

i w

so-4- 0 la-H- b

Earth as guests in the home of
their son and family, Mr. and Mrs.-Raifor-

Daniel Jr. and children.
TOM ROSS of Flomont, for-

merly of Olton, has been a patient
four weeks in the Veterans Hospi-
tal in Dallas, where he underwent
surgery.

MRS. NETTIE MAE HALL of
Littlbfield, formerly of Olton,
visited friends in Hi-Plai- Hospi

mJL i. I!

Ij
-- tfi

LITTLEFIELD, TEXAS, SUNDAY,
transferredfrom a private room to
the ICU, at the Methodist Hospi-
tal, Lubbock.

MR. AND MRS. JohnWackman
visited Thanksgiving afternoon in
Lubbock, at the home of her
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Wolfe and
other relatives, Mr. and Mrs.
Weldon Harkness and Mr. and
Mrs. Gary Smith and small daugh-
ter, Amber.

i V

i ? i

!&

iW
ljrAv

A

THE PRAD0
i&7

Handsome Swedish knit suit of 100uo Polyes-
ter. Pleated panel front, front and back yoke,
patch pockets Your choice of Navy, Dusty
Tan, Dusty Green, Dusty Blue, or Block. Sizes

reg long.

REG. $55

niece,

iftB! iH

SALE

RsSjI'

MEN'S

SUITS
SEVERAL

STYLES

r iff

MEN'S

WESTERN STYLE

SPORT

SUITS

REG0 S39-S- 45

SIZES 36-- 46

REGS & TALLS

SEVERAL COLORS

t

jfk

FABRIC SALE
ENTIRE STOCK CORDUROY $199
REG. S2.99 & S3.99 I

QUILTED FABRIC REG. 52.79 139

V.I.P. DUCK

BOTTOM WEIGHT, REG. S2.49 197

BLOUSE WEIGHT, REG. SI .99 M44

tal in Hale CenterWednesday.
A BAZAAR and bake sale was

held Dec. 3 and 4 in the Girl
Scout House. Sponsoredby mem-
ber of Victory Baptist Church, the
saleopenedfrom 10 a.m. to 5 p.m.

MRS. L. G. (VAN) ELKINS re-

ceived treatmentat Hos-
pital in Hale Center Wednesday
night. She returned home Wed-
nesday night.
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r OLTON NEWS
I MRS. W. B. SMITH, JR.

V 285-238-5

1
W. B. SMITH JR. returned

homeThursday from the
Hospital in Hale Centerwhere he
received treatment for more than
two weeks. Visiting W. B. while he
was in the hospital were his two
sisters and two brothers. Mrs.
ChesterPierce of Abernathy, Mrs.
Durwood Wheeler of Monahans,
Tom Cook Smith of Olton and
George Smith of Hale Center,and
a host of friends, both from Hale
Center and Olton.

MRS. RONDA HAIR, Darren
and La Dondaof Lubbockspentthe
Thanksgiving holidays here visit-

ing in the homes of her parents.
Mr. and Mrs. EarlRobertson; also
in the homeof Mr. and Mrs. Bailey
Hair.

THANKSGIVING guests in the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Basil
Sherman were Dr. and Mrs. Lynn
Kite of Bonham, Mr. and Mrs.
RustySherman, Leslie andLeisa of
Lubbock and Mrs. Lee Sherman.
The Fites are former Oltonites.

MEMBERS of Main Street
Church of Christ are having a
special er Sunday Dec.
5. Following the preaching hour
Sunday morning all members are
ask to bring food for a pot-luc- k

meal, which will be served in
Fellowship Hall. At the 6 p.m.
meeting, Jim McGuiggan of the
Sunset School of Preaching in
Lubbock, formerly of Ireland, will
speak to the Sunday School teach-
ers of the church. Brother McGuig-
gan will speak to all adults at 7
p.m. Don Jones local pastor,
invites all members to be present
and bring guestswith them to this
service.

MR. AND MRS. James Gal-

lagher visited during the Thanks-
giving holidays in Cleburn in the
home of his brotherand sister-in-la-

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Gallagher.
GUESTS Thanksgiving Day in

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Archie
.Sorley and Cynthia were Mr. and
Mrs. Johnny Lewis and Trent of
Houston; Mr. and Mrs. Bill
Schreier of Abernathy; Rev. and
Mrs. John E. Lewis, Mrs. Pearl
Schreier and Mrs. Ethel Schreier.

MRS. (Jewel) I. B. Holt fell
Tuesdayat herhome andfractured
a bone in her shoulder. She is
receiving treatment at Central
Plains General Hospital in Plain-vie-

RAIFORD DANIELS SR. took
his wife to Littlefield Tuesday for
her physical check-u- p.

MR. AND MRS. Randall Small,
Jerri, Kelli and Toni of Dimmitt
spentThanksgiving Day herevisit-
ing in thehomeof his parents,Mr.
and Mrs. J. L. Small. Other dinner
guestsThursday in theJ. L. Small
home were his brother-in-la- w and
sister,Mr. and Mrs. E. J. McCox.

KAREN AND DAWN Grant of
Lubbock visited Thanksgiving Day
in the home of their grandmother,
Mrs. Myrtle Grant.

MR. AND MRS. C. T. Lokey
visited friends and relatives in
Kansas for a few days last week. .

MRS. BILL KELLEY underwent :

major surgery Wednesday morn--
ing in Central Plains General-- '

Hospital in Plainview.
SUNDAY. Mrs. Freeman Davis .

of Lazbuddievisited in the home of
Mrs. Ethel Schreier.

MR. AND MRS. Joe Dale Chit- -
wood of Houstonvisited during the
Thanksgiving holidays in the home
of their parents, Mr. and Mrs. .

Dale Chitwood and Mr. and Mrs.
Ray Culwell.

MRS. LEILA POWELL of Col-
umbus, Mo. spent the Thanksgiv-
ing holidays visiting in the homeof
her mother, Mrs. Helen Bohner
and other friends and relatives at
Olton.

W. B. SMITH JR. returned
home Thursday morning from Hi-- "
Plains Hospital in Hale Center,
where he received treatmentabout "

two weeks
MRS. W. B. Smith Jr. returned

homo Friday from Hospi-
tal in Hale Center, where she
received treatment four days for
Sinusitus and allergy. Both of their
children were home for Thanks,
giving. They are Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Bonner and Sean of Albu-
querque, N.M. and Billy Roy
Smith of Dallas.

MR. AND MRS. Jack Hysinger,
Kanetha, Monty and Trent of
Muleshoe visited Wednesday
night and Thanksgiving Day wth
Hysinger'smother, Mrs. Freddie
Mae Hysinger.

TOM COOK SMITH visited in
Hale Center Wednesday after--
noon.
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Bros. StampsDOUBLE TUESDAY & WEDNESDAY

FRYERS
USDA INSPECTED,

fRESH DRESSED, WHOLE, LB.

SAUSAGE
ACON

ARMOUR, PKG.

SMOKED, CENTER CUT,
SLICED SLAB, LB.

ORK CHOPS $1

CHUCK ROAST
OUND STEAK

SIRLOIN STEAK

CLUB STEAK
T-BO-

NE STEAK
PICNICS WILSON, LB.

BACON ENDS & PIECES decker, 3-- lb. box

BOLOGNA RANCH BRAND, 12 OZ0

FRANKS RANCH BRAND, 12 OZ. PKG.

BEEF LIVER FRESH SLICED, LB.

COFFEE

SUGAR
MILK
TUNA
FLOUR

OFFEE

MARYLAND CLUB, ALL GRINDS,
CAN

WHITE SWAN, PURE CANE,
5-- BAG

PLAINS, VALLEY FRESH, 12 GALLON

VAN CAMP, 6 14 OZ ,

GLADIOLA, 5-- LB. BAG

FOLGERS, 10 OZ.,
INSTANT

fj&jfffft MQJf fjjffi( 1

BANANAS

APPLES

DOLE, GOLDEN RIPE, LB.

WASHINGTON EXTRA FANCY
DELICIOUS, RED OR GOLDEN

AVOCADOS LARGE SIZE

LETTUCE CALIFORNIA, ICE BURG, LB.

RATATACC COLORADO RUSSETS,
ALL PURPOSE, 10-L- B. BAG

T COCA COLA 1

P l
RUBBLE UP J

DR PEPPER
6 BOTTLE CRTN., 32 OZ.

WITH PURCHASE OF $10.00OR MORE

WRIGHTS,

I $129 ft

09
LB.

CHOICE,

LB.

CHOICE, LB.

CHOICE, LB.

CHOICE, LB.

USDACHO'CE, LB.

69'
99'
59'

59'
39'

1

CENTER

CUT,

USDA

BLADE CUT,

USDA

USDA

USDA

PKG.

lb!

79

89
89
1

59
98

TOWELS
HI DRI, LARGE ROLL

K ukeendears cut,
T GREEN GIANT.

29

289'

16

PEAS JOAN Of ARC,

CORN OUR

WKORCS 17 389

WHITE SWAN, 8 0Z. 699
KAYRO,

RED 32 OZ.

$139 BREAD
SOFT-N-LIT- E, 1 12 LOAF

$j39 277
IF YOU'RE NOT SATISFIED WITH YOUR BEEF, TRY OURS. WE
GUARANTEE SATISFACTION. WE SELL ONLY USDA CHOICE
BEEF. NO CHEMICALS ADDED TO OUR BEEF. IN STOCK DAILY:

RIB EYES, BONELESS CLUBS. CUT-U- P FRYERS & CHICKEN
PARTS. WE INVITE YOUR ORDER FOR SPECIAL CUTS.

WE SELL THE BEST FOR LESS.

Freezer Beef Always Available.
Cut & Wrapped To Your Specifications.

PRODUCE SPECIALS

DARLING

MACARONI & CHEESE

DINNER STO'JFFERS, 12 OZ,

YY 0NUTS

TOMATO SAUCE

WELCH, ALL

FLAVORS, 12 OZ.

59'

77f TURNOVERS PEPT .FARM' 59'

rEilV.n duuim, iouz., -- '

21 SHORTENING
SW CRISCO, 3-- CAN S1 49

$369MIRACLE WHIP
KRAFT, QUART

LABEL,

99
i$i TEA vHiTE swan nstant-3z.jar-

i

4j5ALT SWAN, 26 233
69' BATHROOM TISSUE

sco"1SS;?Gmm 79'
PBECCDtfEC SAVORY STRAWBERRY, APRICOT,rKE3CKVE3 0R PEACH 8 Qz

oz. 4vy

499'

OZ.

59

riLLCId

H,TE OZ.

69'
OPEN SEVEN DAYS A WEEK 8:00 A.M. TILL 8:00 P.M.

Uttlefleld's Full Service Super Market

LlTTHFIM
ufeh market

AMHERST NEWS
SUNDAY GUESTS of Mr. and

Mrs. W. L. Downing were Mr. and
Mrs.Vns Montos, Susan and Jim-

my, Mr. and Mrs. Larry Scruggs,
Mr. and Mrs. B. Brandon of
Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. Owen
Taylor of Littlefiold.

MR. AND MRS. Homer Harper
and her sister,Chloe Harris, areat
Corpus Christi this week and will

visit relatives while in that area.
MR. AND MRS. Virgil Cooper

have returned to Lutz, Fla. Her
mother, Mrs. Cassie Gainer, is in
the Hospitality House in Little-fiel- d.

MR. AND MRS. James Cox
attendedfuneral services for her
uncle, Mr. Dwight Strain in Wea-therfor- d,

Thanksgiving Day and
returned by Wichita Falls for a
visit with her aunt, Mrs. Flossie
Wyche.

THANKSGIVING Day was Mr.
and Mrs. J. H. Bradley's 64th
wedding anniversary,also. They
had their son, Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Bradley of Canyon and Bill here
with them for dinner.

MR. AND MRS. Tom Davis
were in Dallas for the Cowboy
football gameThanksgiving.

MRS. T. J. BATSON was a
Thanksgiving dinner guest of her
granddaughter, Mr. and Mrs.
Jimmy Palmer and three children
in Littlefield.

REV. AND MRS. Gene B.
Louder and Monte of Jayton
visited her mother, Mrs. Lester La
Grange and aunt, Mrs. Walton
Macmanus Friday.

MR. AND MRS. Vernon (Mut)
Houk were in Hereford Thanksgiv-
ing with their son, Gary and
family.

MRS. ELTON FAUST spent
Thanksgiving in Lubbock with her
son, Eddie Mac and family.

THANKSGIVING guests of V.
O., Willie and Charlie White were
Mr. and Mrs. Hartley Simmons of
Estes Park, Colo, and their daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Dan Pribble and
Chaunn of Perryton.

MRS. MARIE PAYNE had
Thanksgiving dinnerwith Mr. and
Mrs. Eugene Priddy.

MRS. R. R. Morgan was

rOUL'ht In .U. .
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Dollar Day Specials

PRICES GOOD

Monday, Dec. 6th.
ONLY

--K Jumpsuits Blouses

tAt Handbags

Denim Overalls Coats

it TurquoiseJewelry

DressesJr. & Misses

Long Dresses

SelectedGroup Of FadedGlory

All Of TheseItems

20 OFF 3

'Since you can'tgo around saying you're

terrific, let our clothesdo it for you'

M L MP

-

!."j

i
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lte planning
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r there are qualification

lll0ns for using tne cur--

value: . .
... rent or more of the
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new tax law will also
lie exemption level as far
e taxes are concerned,
t Prater. "A unified tax

aid include estate taxes

conomist cites these ex--

estatetaxes. Starting in
ere m be a tax credit ot
for any estate having a
U.00Q in 1978; $38,000 in

ftsMiniPsn'tiru S47.nnn
Ld thereafter. Comparing
Ita MPmntinn pniiivnlont

iean $120,667 in 1977;
Ibi1978;S147,333in 1979;
In 1980; and $175,625 in
individual.

sw tax bill provides a
amaritaldeductions,ena--

p spouse to leave $250,000
1 of the estate, which--

Sreater, to the surviving

,'",, M'l''M
'"!. 0,,..,

l0

I PUe 8

316 Phelps

In addition to this
there is nn additional $100,000
lifetime marital deduction gift

that one spouso can
give to the other spouse with no
tax, notesPrater.This has to come
from separateproperty.

"Another feature is
theprivilege of paying estatetaxes
over 15 yearsat 4 percent interest
if 65 per cent of the adjusted tax
estatequalifies as a farm, ranch or
closely held business. The federal

will havea first lien on
propertyduring this period of tax
payout," explains Prater.

The recaptureof estatetaxes is
also affected by the new

If a farm or ranch is sold out
of a family within 10 years,estate
taxeson the total fair market value
can be If the property
is held 10 to 15 years, thetaxes can
be partially

Stateof Texas laws
remain the same.

"All of theseplus other changes
broughton by the new tax legisla-
tion make it for mana-
gers and owners of farms and
ranchesto review and revise estate
plans so that all

are realized,"
Prater.

KEEP COLD
Eggnog should not stand at

room for any length of
time. Freezesomeof it in the form
of ice cubes or in a ring mold to
add to pitcher or punch bowl. The
eggnog will keep cold without
being diluted.

Eggnog can be prettily deco-

rated with dollops of whipped
cream orscoopsof ice cream which
have been with strips of
citron or angelica and a bit of
maraschino or candied red cherry
to simulate holly.

KEEP THEM SOFT
Soft cookies shouldbe be stored

in containers into which you place
a an apple. Change the
apple every otherday or soto keep
the cookies moist. For crisp
cookies, a cookie tin with a tightly
fitting cover is best.

Christmas
King Special

BUY KING SIZE

Mattress & Spring

299

LnGfe

50 And Get

Pak Free
PAK

7000 Frame
Sheets

King Pillows

W RETAIL

WMtX VALUE

rfiXKWrirt

fl MMUUmm B

0 Bt B

lUttlefield.TeiM

deduction,

exemption

important

government

legisla-
tion.

recaptured.

recaptured.
inheritance

important

management
opportunities em-
phasizes

temperature

DECORATIONS

garnished

quartepf

lord Box

Bonus

r

flMBMEBft

BONUS
1 -
1 - Set
2 -
1 - Bedspread

a,SSlP 109
Muffin Stand

BY Garndor

4995

PlanterStand
BY Garndor

5495

V Bf wV
fflaHrt

50

3'

ki
WXmkXQJm
MSPSKSi

;k. hurn'&&&
REG. S3.47

MEN'S

ARRIVED

WEST

m

L

REG. S8.99

j Jr

?
I frtttCM ltl--

fe

CS

x

REG, S8.88

KING SIZE

REG. S7.99

JUST NEW STYLE

AT

MENS M
k m m

ALL WINTER

MN'S,

tsse
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QUILTED

LADIES ROBE

$177

PILLOWS

FLANNEL SHIRTS

BOOTS
$m DURANGO COMPARE $49.99

ySi,

POLYESTER

$29"
DICKIES

FLARES, COLORED

CJ7

COATS

i1'

CLy' WOMEN'S, CHILDREN'S

10

.

S

OFF

A REPEAT ON MAGIMATIC

218 CAMERA OUTFIT
SOLD OUT LAST TIME

BUT RECEIVED

fk NEW STOCK

PISTOLS

PACK

NICE OF 17 PISTOLS SIO.OOOCFON THF

& ONE O- - YOUR CHOICE . PRICED FROM $59.99TO
toil nn Aicr i hone cncrTioKi rt ic? uAr

1 $10.00OFF ON YOUR PRICED

FROM $169.00TO $219.99,'

GIISON'S I

I

LEADER-NEWS- , LITTLEF1ELI), DECEMBER

s-'- 7

SELECTION

REVOLVERS, CHOICE.

rv Come in and have your picture madewith Santa.

'. BLi L.. - n . .!.! ...... I I

Wx

m

rnuroi oy viecia. ncruresaeuverea in one weeK.

You get a 5x7 & 6 for

j5. SI

WM If. 1

TODAY 1 --5
billfold sizes

BED COMFORTER
SUNDAY ONLY rW&

REG, 1.97

tiu

REG.

BOYS SHIRTS
REG, S3.99

;&IJLM L0NG SLEEVE

JL

S14.99

DRESS SHIRTS
MEN'S

REG. $7.99 --,

COVERALLS
DICKIE

a -- v;

CV7

I!4

v

JUST 4T' '

199

CHOCOLATE CHERRIES
BRACH'S

CREKTOES

ARRIVED

12 02. BOX 110
REG. $1.37 NOW I

ALBUMS & TAPES

SI .00 OFF OF YOUR CHOICE .

FROM S4.99UP

THE PERFECT

POCKET RADIO
MnnillTVAKA

REG, $6.99 lUS
VALUE

llJ

177
ONLY Mm (SJJJ

TELSTAR
2 ONLY

COMPARE AT $89.99

FOR VIDEO SPORTS

GAMES ON ANY TV.

?

r-- -v

S)
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District Suits
ELNA LYNN MILLER andW. E.

Miller versus John P. Strutzel and
Querner Truck Lines, Inc., auto-

mobile collision, personal injuries
and property damage, filed Oct.
5.

LINDA PHELPS versus James
Phelps, reciprocal enforcement of
child support,filed Oct. 6.

EDDIE CLIFTON and Mary
BessWarnerversusBillie Guthrie,
suit on account, filed Oct. 7.

JOYCE ALUNE LIGHT versus
J. A. Tomhagen, et al, trespassto
try title, filed Oct. 11.

CHARLIE JONES versus Tom-

my Alair, Jimmy Alair, Johnny
Alair, and Eddie Alair, doing
business as Alair Custom Enter-
prises, damage to hay rake, filed
Oct. 13.

ANNETTE RANDALL versus
Darrell Randall, reciprocal en-

forcement of child support, filed
Oct. 15.

PENNY KAY DIRR versus
David Roger Dirr, reciprocal en-

forcement of child support, filed
Oct. 18.

DONNY KIM SMITH versus
Phillips Motor Co., Inc., Spicer
Mfg. Corp. and General Motors
Corp., breach of warranty, filed
Oct. 19.

JOELANE versusHoustonGen-

eral Insurance Co., workmen's
compensation,filed Oct. 19.

GENE HANLIN, doing business
as Hanlin Auto Parts and City
Wrecking versusJamesE. Brown,
suit on account, filed Oct. 22.

JOHNNIE SMITH and Minnie
Smith versus George Isbeil, tres-
passto try title, filed Oct. 22.

LAMB COUNTY Publishing Co.
versusEdward Carroll, fraud, filed
Oct. 22.

CITIZENS State Bank, Earth,
versus Jack Daugherty, suit on
promissory note, filed Oct. 2G.

SHARON F. BOMBRIA versus
Edward L. Bombria III, reciprocal
enforcementof support, filed Oct.
26.

CITIZENS State Bank, Anton,

You'll
Find
lne

rertect
Gift At

PUBLIC RECORDS

During

Shoes Sportswear
VIVO & SUSAN THOMAS

SPORTSWEAR
Jackets $52.95 Values Now

Jackets SI 2. 95 Value Now

PailtS S28.00 Values Now

JOHANSEN & BARE FOOT
Originals $42.95 VALUE

DRESS HEELS
MENS

DRESS SHOES

NOW

LADIES SHOES
523.95 VALUES NOW $495

$22.95 VALUES NOW $7"
BOYS AND GIRLS

SHOES S,6-95LU-
E

NOW

Moss Shoes
&

Sportswear
426 Phelps

SeeUs

&

Wrap Up

Christmas

versus JamesR. Landis, suit on
note, filed Oct. 26.

In the matter of the marriages
of:

Kathleen Williams and Doyle G.
Williams, divorce was granted
Oct. 18.

Thomas E. Elliott and Patricia
Ann Elliott, divorce was granted
Oct. 12.

Rena Faye McLelland and Ar-

thur Hugh McLelland, divorce was
grantedOct. 6.

Orval Kirby and Nell Kirby,
divorce was grantedOct. 18.

Bowling
News

LANE LOVERS LEAGUE
Powell's Upholstery 15 5

Pay& Save 15 5

Wells 12 8
City Auto 10 10
Sonic 10 10
Flores 9 11

PizzaHut 5 15
Kut Hut 4 16

Hi Team Series Well's Trucking
2568

Hi Team Game Well's Trucking
885

Hi Individual Series Women
Marilyn Wells 546

Hi Individual Game Women
Marilyn Wells 201

LANE LOVERS LEAGUE
Powell's Upholstery 18 6
Pay& Save 15 9
City Auto 14 10
Sonic Drive In 1314 10 Vt

Wells 13 11
Flore's Upholstery 12 12
PizzaHut 5j 1814
Kut Hut 5 19

Hi Team Series Powell's Uphol-
stery 2416

Hi Team Game Sonic Drive In
906

Hi Individual Series Women
Bobbie Wagley 480

Hi Individual Game Women
Helen Campbell 193

i t .- a u--'- -

J?ZJ-----Mg2-Zk,

Moss &

IOAOQ "?CP?l

L

'fm

M

DANIEL

GREEN

HOUSE

SHOES
$588

29" 'j.;iiii
i9" -- r9

LkJj.n-i-
oo .k&vs;

vJ 0FFZ217

$34.99
NOW

I &

autJTS K$399

385-36-26 Vpo

7Tt
DINGO

Jump Suits

22"

22"

3Ti
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BETS?

kw

.9
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385-34-22

Jf ONLY K
B IT

I Shopping 1
Days leftM

BIRTHYEAR SETS
For That Special

GrandsonOr Grandaughter.

BICENTENNIAL SETS
Available In Varying Styles.

GenuineOld Silver Dollars
1878-19- 03

J Each

S & M COINS

A'AViVIJ

East 9th

Littlefield,

GT-Ma- tic 1 1 Color Tuning
GT-2- 00 Solid-Sta- te Chassis
Darl-Li- te 50 Color Picture Tube
AFC-Perma--

jJIHTpTtV T

1500

Texas
$4

LARRY SANDERSON

FRtt

The Bid

AU

In ErnestMi

At

E. 9th
Or

E.
YOUR GIFT CENTER

- . Uij.i.h, .

FOR RARE OR PRACTICAL GIFTS

ALSO

YOUR ONE STOPSHOPPING CENTER

FOR YOUR PLANTING SEEDS

OR

COTTON SELLING

;;!, , CITY ANQCHOOL TAX OFFICES

, V- - . D

HERE TOO

CAMadOftiefJiJcL
SHOPTODAY

.fc- -

it
.

LITTLEFIELD SERVICE CENTER
1500 E. DELANO

12"
tSolld State UHF Tuner

120 Volts
Automatlc Gain Control
70 Position Click-St- op

UHF Tuning

THIS WEEK

WITH PURCHASE OF EITHER (Others

$7799W5T

$JJ,Q95

'"" ""' "." V

" i

b rnBfiy 11 1 mww M

GT-Ma- tic 1 1 Color Tuning
GT-3- 00 Solid-Sta- te Chassis

70-Posit- ion Click-St- op UHF Tuning
Lighted Channel Indicator

Und,

The

1500

Delani

PORTABLE

Available)

iffHMHDlHHIilHv

AFC-Perma--

SylvaniaGT-Matic-E

9rvi --"wwiMil 1B-- B illij
jfc,;:

1500

rj itfrt...

': 81



iof

'k v jcnr It , j I ( jolr)KHHM fsa iEX

nOCTERTO HISI
Building

CES

e
ID '.4. 'taB

"'at k-'- T. . .

IB. IDWT1U "k .a&fe'
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hm Coin

& COINS
1500 East 9th

LittleHeld, Texas
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Model RHJ9I

PHONE 385-34-22
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iJQTHIS CHRISTMAS
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Git Suggestions
For The Golfer. . .

tAt Cm6s Caps

it Head Covers ir Balls

Sfiirfs (i oo Cotton) Bags
-S-PECIAL-Ram,

Wilson LD, Omega Golf Balls, SI 2.50 Doz.

ERNEST

MILLS

1517 E. 9th.
(ERNEST MILLS

COTTON CO.)

Pro Shop
TWO LOCATIONS

385-51-78

LITTLEFIELD SERVICE CENTER

IIIK KELVIN ATOR
WE MEASURE OF QUALITY S1SCE 1914

CERAMIC GLASS SMOOTH TOP

CONTINUOUS CLEAN OVEN

PROGRAMMED OVEN COOKING

ILLUMINATED BACK GUARD,

CLOCK, MINUTE MINDER

2 CONVENIENCE OUTLETS (1 TIMED)

ELECTRIC RANGE

REG.59995

TRI LEVEL DOUBLE OVEN

CONTINUOUS CLEAN OVENS

BOTH OVENS LIGHTED

AUTOMATIC PROGRAMMED COOKING

LIFT UP TOP

FLOURSCENT WORK LIGHT

REG. $599w

LARRY SANDERSON

;

LITTLEFIELD

COUNTRY

CLUB

NffiJpojP,

WEEK

$450

LITTLEFIELD SERVICE CENTER
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High blood pressure:

nothing to fear?
There is much abouthigh blood

pressureto fear.
For this disease,which doctors

usually call hypertension, has no
unusual symptoms. And in 90 per
cent of the cases,doctors can't
determinethe cause. It is a major
contributor in the development of
heartattack andstroke, heart and
kidney failure diseaseswhich
togetherkill more 900,000Ameri-
cans each year.

But this silent killer which can
strike without warning this mys-

terious killer for which sciencestill
seeksa cause is easily detected
and can usually be controlled.

If you are a black American,
there is additional reason to be
concerned. You ore twice as likely
to have high blood pressureas a
white American.

It will strike atanearlierageand
will probably be more severe.
Science doesn't yet know why
black Americans or anybody else
has high blood pressure.And they
don't know why it is more prev-
alent among blacks. But research
is seeking causesand, hopefully,
cures.

Meanwhile, take hope. High
blood pressure can easily be
detected by a painless, inexpen-
sive medical examination. And it
can be controlled.

But what is frightening about
high blood pressureis the apathy
of people who can't take seriously
a disease which does not moke
them feel bad. Then there are
those who foolishly assumethat
because an examination five or
more yearsago found their pres-
sure normal, there's no need to
have it checked again. These
people are asking for trouble
heart trouble.

There isanotherkind of danger-
ous apathy the "let George do
it" attitude. Some day they'll
worry about heart disease when
they're older, for after all, isn't it
one of the diseasesof aging?

Of course,this is not true. Heart
disease strikespeople of any age,
any race, any sex. And this is why
all Americans should beinterested
in learninghow to reduce their risk
of thesetwo killers heart attack
and stroke.

The Lamb County Heart Asso-
ciation recently conducted its an-

nual Heart Funddrive to raisethe
dollars necessaryto support its
many programsin heart research,
education and community service.

So take care of your heart by
getting a blood pressuretest and
by following your doctor's advise
to control it. And support your
Heart Association.

net
state 168,716

Comptroller Bob Bullock an-

nounced Friday that his Lubbock
Enforcement Office, which serves
Lamb County, collected $168,716
in taxes during the first two
months of the current fiscal year
(September and October). Audits
by the office yielded $102,433 in
additional taxes owed the state.

Bullock said theoffice conducted
41 audits in Septemberand Octo-

ber, yielding an average $113 in
additional taxesowed thestateper
audit hour.

' 'I'd say that that'sa prettygood
return on our investment," said
Bullock. "These audits produce
money that otherwise would have
gone uncollected if we hadn't dug
it out."

Bullock emphasized that the
collections by his Lubbock office
are in addition to the state taxes
routinely paiddirectly to Austin by
Lubbock-are- a taxpayers.

The Comptroller's 36 district
offices collected a total of $9,777,-91- 9

in taxes for the two months
and uncovered through audits
$5,112,000 in additional taxes
owed the state.

The Lubbock office, headedby
Donald F. Paxton, is located in
Suite 400, 4902 34th Street, in the
Terrace Shopping Center, and is
open from 7:30 a.m. to 5:30 p.m.
The telephonenumberis 795-069- 1 .

The Lubbock officeserves Lub-

bock, Bailey, Borden, Cochran,
Cottle, Crosby, Dawson, Dickens,
Floyd, Gaines, Garza, Hale, Hock-

ley, Kent, King, Lamb, Lynn,
Motley, Terry and Yoakum

iDollar Day Special

BRADLEY
COORDINATES

Black & White

20 V

Off

MONDAY ONLY

BankAmericard
Master Charge

Taxes

403 Phelps

Lay-Awa-ys

Welcome
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NO WSCHASE NECESSARY

tGlStK ON EVERY VISIT
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ovenson sale now till

prices begin
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2 free cooking classeswith the r ase
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TANGLEWOOD

RIGHT

ARRIVED...

J FOR SANTA

25 OFF

ON RCA CAR

STEREO TAPE

WHILE

LASTS.

PERFECT FOR CHRISTMAS
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FOR CHRISTMAS
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christmas.
special

25995

Oven.

CONSOLE STEREOS

PRICED

GIVING.

PLAYERS

PRESENT SUPPLY

GIFTING.

SOUNDESIGN STEREOS, TAPE

PLAYERS, POCKET RADIOS,

JUST

ACCENT PIECES

TILL

BY

I .

1
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CLOCK RADIOS, TAPE RECORDERS.

CREDIT PLANS AVAILABLE

OPEN 9-5- :30 WEEKDAYS

SATURDAY AFTERNOONS CHRISTMAS

AFTER HOURS APPOINTMENT

':

Colors

Several ry
-- Wii5fc

ll

FURNITURE &. APPLIANCE
Home owned -- Home operated

Richard & Norma Wall
385-46-14 229 Phelps

I!

ALL SOFA

SLEEPERS

SPECIAL PRICED

FOR CHRISTMAS.

VIRGINIA HOUSE

BOSTON ROCKERS

REDUCED

&2,

)k ALLRECLINERS J
(C REDUCED FOR 7)
((CHRISTMAS GIFTING.))

Types Fabrics
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Vour Gift Now & Deliver )
lt For Christmas.

Ballots received in the Commu-

nity Committee Election in the
Lnmb County office will be tabu-

lated on December 10 in the Lamb

County ASCS office in Littlefield.
The newly elected Community

Committee will hold a County
Conventionon December15, at the
samelocation. During the Conven-

tion the Community Committee-

men will elect one person to serve
a three-yea-r term on the County
Committee and determine the
position to be occupied by each
member of the 1977 County Com-

mittee (Chairman, Vice Chairman,
and member).

Details are hard to come by but
we anticipate that a referendum
will be conductedby mail ballot in
the Cotton Research andPromo-
tion Referendum from December
13, to December 17. Channel 11 in
Lubbock will carry a program on
this referendum on December 9th
at 9 p.m. This program is to
explain the purposeof the referen-
dum and the Cotton Research and
Promotion Act.
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Poinsettia
Prices Stan

At

Register

Wagley Greenhouses
Bula Hiway Mile West Of Overpass
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LeaderNews

Christmas

Sunday,

We have special benefit which now be enjoyedby our regular
Leader-New- s readers.We think will makesenseto you.

Now you can give Christmasgifts of The Leader-New- s special
rate.

In addition the savingsand convenienceyou already enjoy,
you can give someone13 monthsof the Leader-New- s for the cost 12.
Pay only 59.50 Lamb County and $11.75 elsewherein Texas.

Here'swhat happenswhen you give The Leader-New- s.

...First, we send beautiful gift card your name.

...Then we begin your gift subscription Christmas week with our
special holiday issue.

...And, of course,you get all the convenienceof Leader-New- s gift.
crush Christmasshoppers.No packagesto wrap, mail, insure

exchange December26th.

Justtear the coupon below and indicate the namesof the people
you want your Leader-New- s gift list. Return to us today,and we'
do the rest...from gift announcementto gift itself.

But now we'll have time to get everything order
Christmasweek. You'll avoid both the commotion and expense
holiday shoppingwhile sending someone whole year of Christmas
good will.

And that makes lot of sense.

One Free
With Each Gift

S9.50 Lnmb County, 1.75 elsewhere
Texas. You renew startyour own sub-
scription special rateonly you order

gift subscriptions.

.TJj

3.00

For

Cordially,

JlPublisher

subscription please
Leader-New- s, starting Christmas,

1- - NAME :

ADDRESS
CITY STATE-ZI- P

NAME
ADDRESS
CITY STATE-ZI- P

Sign Card: From

subcription special
subscriptions.

squarebelow.

start) subscription

special

vwwwvvvvvvTivvvvnvwvvv-Bmvm-B-Bv- v

ft-

U
. P&& rff'".

Dec.

Hflllrli H n iv "ur rrizes

On 12

a can
it

at a

to now

of
in

a announcement in

No on or

on

off
on it

do it so in by

of

a

a

in SI in
may or

at this
one or more

'K

.)

"ZS

S

If

tt M

:

c

a

II

U
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You may renew or start your own
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Also renew (or my own
at the same rate.
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PEP SEWS

MRS. CONRAD DEMEL

fbonc
9J3"Mo

ooinAL shower honoring

.Martha Mngnoss, bride-ole- ct

'' ...luimnn. was held inNT Z, 7 trnmO.A
, Parish iB ;":" " :

Her COlorS 01 siruwuuwjr iku
greenery nnd white were

liout. The serving table was

jth a Willie Ciuw uvmwu
.white lace inuieciuwi mm un

.rnent of strawberry rea
6p....,lmrrv ntincll. BSSOrt--

les. 3u" "' nnrl...Wno mitn mintsl.i nt riRJMcai -
(reserved to guestswith crystal

fflntments. me i u
Ej Miss Marci Myers 01

Lock and groom's mother,
Agnes Jjcmoumun were

i the guests. Hostesses'

r. Valeria Shannon, Marcy

oel, Lydia Green, Evelyn Al-- '.

Milker and Evelyn Followill.
ilSS BRENDA KUHLER, a

tot at Angelo State Univer--

San Angelo visited in the

ae of her mother, Mrs. Hilda

ance Kuhler and Mr. and Mrs.

jdyandTammiot luddock aiso
tiled during tne inunKsgiving
hki.
MRS. ALICE KUHLER and her
ichterand family, Mr. and Mrs.

ie Braum and children,
Roger and Robbin, all of

tiiita, visited with relatives and
tsds in Pep Community during

ie inanKsgiviiiB "u"uu;i"
MR, AND MRS. JustinDemel of

Ikhita, Kans. visited with his
Lrents, Mr. and Mrs. Gaulbert
Lmel and family and relatives
U friends during the Thanksgiv- -

' holidays. Pam Demel, their
szhier, a student at South

lams Junior College and Van--

la, another daughter, a student
l West Texas State University,

lajon were also home during
thanksgiving holidays.

MR AND MRS. ClarenceAlbus
and family of Baytown visited

i the home of his parents, Mr.
U Mrs. Clarence Albus Sr.
Iruig the Thanksgivingholidays.

R. AND MRS. Charles Shan--

i and daughter of Clovis, N.M.
hi Mrs and Mrs. Don Shannon
bd daughter of Plainview and
laeShannon,a student at Steven

Austin University was home
biting their mother, Mrs. Valeria

anon during the Thanksgiving
plays.

AND MRS. Sam Albus,
!r and Mrs. William Albus, and
lia Albus, all of Lubbock and
If and Mrs. Kenneth Albus of
Jflimcari, N.M. and Mr. and
!n Leonard Albus Jr. and son of
Afield visited in the home of
Sr parents, Mr. and Mrs. Leon--
A Albus Sr. during the Thanks--

pig holiday.
(MR AND MRS. Albert Sim
mer and family of Hereford and

J!r and Mrs. Jerald Simacher and
Jy of Big Spring visited in the

pne of their parents, Mr. and
p. Frank Simnacherduring the
"awtsgiving holidays.

MR AND MRS. Don Hogue and
"y Mr. and Mrs. Larry Hogue

ad Dean Hoeue. all of Levcllnnrl.
Fdwith their parents,Mr. and
I'M L, V Hoeue durinc the

anksgivinc holidavs.
MICHAEL BURT of Fort Worth

PjMr and Mrs. C. E. Dickerson
pboysofLittlefield visited in the

n Of Mr. and Mrs. Chnrles
during the Thanksgiving holi- -

JVCE ALBUS of T.nhWW vi.
m the home of her parents,

' and Mrs VmA ai,..d ,...--:

Thanksgiving holidays.
';awu MRS. Don Benneck
wendaGreen, sturinnts nt Snl

f University of Alpine, visited
w nome of their parents,Mr.

J Mn. Franklin Green during
Thanksgiving holidays.
' AND MRS. Danny Miller

13(1 lamilv nf MM1 I - 1

Robert vi.ni, -- J'a ' j
,? Mrs. Maynard Miller,

Of l.flvnlln, ,.!!tJ ...:u
(In '""", viaueu wiwi
TllVes anA f2 l i iL.- -- ..u uiciiua IU lilt!

"kglVini? Dnv Fnofi.-o- l of Pan
pnshHall.

DAVin npun. ....
t A&M University of College
LC' ana urothea Demel, a
. w,l al Smith Dl! !..!- -

I. """HI ( IU1II3 UUIIIUI
W Of LevellnnH vtotfoH wtih

ents, Mr. and Mrs, Con.
,n during the Thanksgiv- -

"a and girls of Lubbock and
. kernel nf 1..1.1 1. iuuuutn, Hiau

Mr?n? ihe hollday' along
nn ..li A

Jr wid Mrs. Eiitrfino nhml
lighter, Christy of Little- -

,0,NNY
DEMEL, a studentat

Texas Tech University of Lubbock
was homevisiting his parents,Mr.
and Mrs. Norman Demel, and Ray
Hardin of Munday during the
Thanksgiving holidays.

THOSE ATTENDING n birth-
day dinner honoring Mrs.
Cecilia Sokorn at Pep Parish Hnll
Nov. 28 were: Mr. and Mrs.
Eugene Sokora and family of
Slaton, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Hughs
of Seminole, Mr. and Mrs. Clinton
Harris and boysof Littlefield, Mrs.
Bridgett Wells and family of
Levelland, Mr. and Mrs. Billy
Sokoraand family of Jasper,Ala.,
Mr. and Mrs. Justin Demel of
Wichita, Kans., Mrs. Alice Kuhler
of Wichita Falls, Mrs. Agnes
Dicker, Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy
Sokoraand girls and Mr. and Mrs.
Gaulbert Demel and family and
Mr. and Mrs. Matt Demel and son,
all of Pep. It was also a family
get-togeth-
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TOMATO

A now "weapon" againstcancer
is now available in Lamb County to
provide the public with current,
factual information on cancer, its
prevention and early detection.

Called the Cencer Information
Service, thenew program utilizes a
toll-fre- e phone line

to answer public inquiries on
cancer. The service will be ex-

tendedto all residentsof Texas by
late this year,

CIS is part of a public
educational effort sponsored by
The University of Texas M. D.
Anderson Hospital and Tumor
Institute with assistancefrom the
American Red Cross. American
Cancer Society and many other
health agencies in Texas
provide services to cancer patients
and their families.
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Funded by the National Cancer
Institute, the CIS functions part
of a nntion-witl- e network.

Open from a.m. to p.m. on
weekdays, the phone lines are
operatedby trainedAmerican Red
Cross volunteers. All background
material used to answer questions
is reviewed by physicians to insure
accuracy.

The program is designed to help
createa positive senseof aware-
nessabout cancer that will encour-
age the public to seek physician
evaluation for early detection and
prompt treatment of suspected
cancers.

"Important diagnostic, treat-
ment, rehabilitation and research

ore occurring more
frequently now. people could
overcometheir fear of cancermany
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VALUES IN FLAVOR
HOLIDA FEASTING!

Steak 98c
BEEF

Cfausk Roast 89
$169 H

T-Bo- ne Steak H
Beef Ribs

Ida
99 I

REG

Mr STEAK

ALL

Hold

W
H
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thSt

IS5SS3

SAUCE

580Z

SUNDAY,

JUMBO

Coca Cola

49

ARMOUR
TREET
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"$129 JSL
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.....isUl

SIZZIERS

FAMILY SCOn ASSORTED BATHROOM H
Tissue 4prkgu 79c
BATH SIZE H
Piai Soap bar Zt
BOW WOW

Dog Food Ubg 89c
DEL MONTE H

IJBruit Cocktail I

li v5ciLI fish CrAWItXM AlS H

MINUTE MAID FROZEN j n H
OrangeJuice cans I H
shurfreTh

-
$155Milk V2 GAL Q H

IPILLSBURY H
QSKjjftur..

Sriw Ofic IVkx
JWMSSSSSSSSSSESSSmM redeemcoupon H
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BOTTLE CARTON
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BREAD
TENDERCRUST
1 12 LB LOAF

Dan! DOUBLE STAMPS TUESDAY & WEUN ESDAY WITH 2,50 OR MORE PURCHASE

. WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO UMIT QUANTITIES?f WE REDEEM AND GIVE STAMPS ON FOOD STAMPS
1 WE SELL AFFILIATED. MONEYORDERS, PAYROLL CHECKS CASHED

37'
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Winter fishing good onTexaslakes Check those1977 seedtags
Texas sportsmen who prema-

turely put nwny fishing gear in the
fall in favor of hunting rifles might
miss somegood fishingopportuni-
ties at several state reservoirs.

Fisheries biologists at the Texas
Parks and Wildlife Department
who are responsible for manage-
ment of statelakeswere contacted
in er for their recom-
mendations on the best fishing
spots and angling techniques.

Lake Texoma and Lewisville

Reservoirin the Dallas-Fo-rt Worth
area are considered to be good

psrsT'Er'Bsra'&OTrs'Srar'JT'Bsi

( l

,

Straightfrom
Santa'sPack!

IP rT
Selection

Western For The

fishing spots for white bass (san-dies-).

Preston Point at the con-

fluence of Wichita rind Red

Rivers is good. Fish slab
lures in open waters 20 to 30 feet
deep.

At West Lake Point
and Stewarts Creek Cut also
should be productive for white
bassin open water using slabs.

Lake Falcon on the
border normally is an attractive

areafor fishing in fall. Fisher-

men fishing off the docks nearthe
town of Zapata are catching crap--

As Handsome A Bunch
Of WesternWear
As You'll Ever Find Such As.

Coats

lKnB ill Xf J . X V. fl

Lamb County's Largest Of

Boots Entire Family.

Cup

the
especially

Lewisville,

Texas-Mexic- o

the

Hats
Shirrs

BILL'S BOOT SHOP
ferairasra'jraira'srrrOTrasrasrasnf

$19.95 .LO

pie with minnows. occasional
walleye and white bass also
taken.

Crappie fishing should good
upperend Lake Palestine

Northeast Texas. The panfish
being taken minnows

waters eight feet deep.
The heating discharge canal

Braunig Lake San Antonio
normally good most species

crappie and catfish. Cat fish
being caught the discharge
outlet with shrimp and bait.

Hybrid strippedbasscatches
things and

using white grubs and trolling
slabs heated water discharge
areas power plant reservoirs.
Lakes Nasworthy San Angelo
and Bastrop east Austin should

especially
hybrid stripers

caught Lake Mayse
Paris trolling white grubs,slabs
and deep-divin- g lures deep
waters along dam.

Rainbow trout fishing continues
good this time year

Guadalupe River below
CanyonDam. Fishermen who
light tackel with small hooks and
split shot keep hook
bottom should catch some trout
stocked lastwinter Parks
and Wildlife Department.

Large sunfish andbass
caught Guadalupe River

earthworms and small spinner
bait.

More good sunfish, catfish and
striped bassfishing had

Colorado River below Long-bor-n

Dam Austin. Minnows,
earthworms and artificial lures
have been most successful
baits.

TRAINING
Each year Veterans Admi-

nistration provides some training
about half nation's

physicians.
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SMALL HOUSEHOLD APPLIANCES
MIRROR-MATI- C Reg. S19.95 ONE LARGE GROUP

SUNBEAM 12 CUP &

Reg. S26.95 q888 DISCONTINUED

, SUNBEAM '
6

Reg. S27.95 $1988 DRYER Reg. S29.95

PRESTO
OS8 40t"o S22.95

SM.95 B 5.95

S29.95
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Farmersbuying certified seedto

plant their 1977 crop should pay

particular attention to the labels on

the seed bag -t- here's been a

change.
"Certified seedsold after Jan. 1

next year must bear two labels
-- one certifying the variety and

the other indicating a numberof

seed quality factors," points out

Dr. Robert B. Metzer, cotton
specialist for theTexas

Extension Service.
Whereas in the past, seed was

certified for both variety and
quality factors, the certification
now pertainsonly to the genetic
identity of the seed. However,
since the Texas seed law still
requiresthat seedquality informa-

tion be truthfully stated,an analy-

sis label must also accompanyall
certified seed, explains Metzer.

"The analysis label will tell the
farmer such things as purity, inert
matter, other crop seed, weed
seed, noxious weed seed and
germination," notes the Texas
A&M University System special-

ist. "The fact that the seed is
certified has nothing to do with
theseparticularfactors."

Metzer explains the new certifi-
cation labeling this way. "Take

for example. TAM-CO- T

SP37 sold as certified seed
must bear a label (blue in color)
that indicates that the seed is
indeed the SP37 variety. The
certification label will show net
weight, kind and variety and who
produced the seed, but nothing on
quality factors. A second labelon
the seedbag will list the various
quality factors mentioned above
and will tell the farmer the
percentagethat the seed contains,
such as the percentof weed seed.

"The main thing for farmers to
remember when buying certified
seedfor the 1977 crop is to look at
both labels on the seed bag,"

LADIES TOTAL WEIGHT

MUNSEY MUNSEY

$1188 AKER-B- R OILER

VANITY
WAFFLE $2488

1 CT. $695 PI" Tax

12 CT. $395 Plus Tax

Men)' other sets tochoose from

LADIES CLUSTER

SET

12 CT. $350

2

BANDS

i ct. $595
12 ct. $295

i I a rrm Si f V:oo

oo

oo

oo

Plus Tax

Plus Tax

Plus Tax

JLr L.1. D pus Tax

USE OUR PLAN ,'

LARGE

DIAMOND PENDANTS &

PRICED.

OF

Metzer. "Both lnbols

must be checked to get tho
complete story on the seed."

The chango in seedcertification
standards in Texas came about
recently in an effort to assure a
more supply of certi-

fied seed and to givo seedmen
more flexibility in producing seed
for different markets,explains tho
specialist. The change also estab-

lishes uniformity with the Federal

f Q

icf. LJ(

moDetf
TptMyuWi

WSBEk

REASONABLY

BANKAMERICARD

CULTURED PEARLS 25 off

12 Price

ALL 20 off

14" STAINLESS9EMAKE....f. SELECTION BRACELETS "p
ODDS ENDS

PERCULATOR

STAINLESS

PERCULATOR HAIR 2288

ELECTRIC COOKERS

Kog.511.yo

productive.

DEEP 1288

MANNING BOWMAN

IRON ELECTRIC SKILLETReg. si9.95$1488

Agricultur-

al

cottonseed,

SETS

RASTER

WEDDING

ROW

WEDDING

LAYAWAY

VERY SELECTION

EARRINGS

SELECTION

emphasizes

day

2?jJ

JEWELRY

12

BEST
& "p Tax

20 OFF

5725.00 $550.00 $925.00

$440
Plus Tax Plus Tax Plus Tnv

'!?.

SeedAct and CncouraKes, ,tional seedtrnrln
SeoH

identity has been
processed under SH?
Texas Seed
enforced
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LADIES WEDDING BAND

12 ct.
Other styles

MEN'S DIAMOND RINGS

ct. $69500
Several others S90.00

MAN'S WEDDING BAND
Heavy

CT. $40000 plusTox

Many styles prices.

LADIES DINNER RINGS

2CT. $119500
Styles

CT. $695
others S39.95 51750.00

ONE LARGE UL

FINE WATCHES

12 Wee

(50 choose

LADIES DIAMOND WATCHES

ONE GROUP BANDS
STEEL REST I.D. 24

STEEL

DRINK MIXER

$100 EACH

FRYER

8r

TABLE

TIMEX
DIGITAL L.C.D. WATCHES ...23495

NORELCO TRIPLE HEAD SHAVER .!3295

LADY

dependable
bvtuVrl.N

y

L.E.D.

REMINGTON SOFTTOUCH SHAVER f.3295

SCHICK FLEXOMATIC SHAVER.J3495
SUNBEAM 23495

GRANDFATHER CLOCK

f580 7ztOoo

HOLIDA)

MOOD

MAKER
tr r cs ii'

I0 L

Values $17.99and

$18.99.Robes ol h,5

Pile acrylic, from

Maiden. White ac-

centedblue,

salmon, lilac or rd I

wrap robe.Coatstyil

"n wmte, pink, blue c

salmon.

Coatstyle in pmko

blue -- or step-i- n J
front in pink, blue,

salmon or lilac,

sizes 40-4-

400 PHELPS

$38500

from plus

White Gold

12
other

Other

nu$

12 ct to 1 12 ct at low, low pri

l pius tox

up tax

and

Plus Tox

1 & UP Plu$ Tax

25 from to 1

SELECTION

to from)

WATCH Pr

FLATWARE- -

PATTERNS

of

TRAVELER

GROOMER

pnk

$17
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The Davisesplan to returnhome
in December. They rent a spa-
cious, blue-painte-d, parquet-floore-d

houseon a Lavras streetso
steepit could take away a visitor's
breath.Their rent comes to $80 a
month on a Peace Corps' living
allowance of about $200 each. All
their rooms have ceilings, a luxury
to be found only in homes of the
affluent. Their furniture is modest,
but stacksof booksare overwhelm-
ing. A copy of Krishnamurti's
' 'TheFlight of theEagle' ' is on the
coffee table in their living room.

"We reached the saturation
point with books about three
months ago," sayswith a smile an
otherwise solemn Davis.

Mrs. Davis, whosesisterworked
as a Peace Corps volunteer in
Bolivia, enjoys Brazil. She com-
ments:

"People here seem more ori-

ented toward enjoying life, they
enjoy life more thanAmericans do.
But as they advance technologi-
cally they'll lose some of the
cosinessof their life.

"Some Peace Corps volun-

teers," shesays, referring to the
living allowance, "are preoccupied
with money the moment they get
off the plane and that's all they
think about until they go home."

"Brazil is getting short-
changed,"comments her bespec-
tacled husband, "this country is
not getting the samebenefits that
the volunteers are, out of their
working here."

"A lot of Peace Corps volun-

teersalso set their goals too high,

f 4U

ACME

BOOTS
REG. S42.50

32
TEXAS IMPERIAL

BOOTS
ALL LEATHER

REG. 542 .5U

NOW

BOYS EARTH

DENIM

516.UU

NOW

95

32'

BOOTS

$795

SEDGEFIELD NG

FLARES

REG.
13'

SEDGEFIELD

FLARES
BOYS 6 TO 14

REG. SI 1.00 $Q0()
NOW

MENS JEANS

LEVIS BELLS

REG. $15.00

$1150
NOW I l

LONG

PARTY DRESSES

$2495

HV.r THHKfflL r -- . ttrvaaBBBaa

SamaaV'al - Llattflaw-- BJaaK
fllhLBiBBBBr yaanKt ""a niraWatHaV v VaW frTflaaBMr
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JOHN DAVIS center), Texas
Peace Corps volunteer, gives nn
outdoor lecture nt Superior Agri-
cultural School in Lavras, north-
west of Rio de Janeiro, Brazil.
Photo by Yves Gerem

their egos are hurt afterwards,"
Mrs. Davis adds.

John Davis is son of Mr. and
Mrs. JohnDavis of Lime Springs,
Iowa. The parentsof Mary Davis,
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Simnacher,
reside in Pep.

Persons interested in joining
Peace Corps or VISTA may call
collect ACTION'S recruitmentof-

fice in Dallas at (214) 749-185- 5 for
more information.

CHEESE CUTTERS
Knives, butter spreaders,

scoops, miniature cleavers,
thread, wire or scissors. All of
thesemay be usedat one time or
another for cutting cheese. It just
depends'uponthevariety of cheese
which each cutting instrumentfits
best. Thread or wire is handy for
cutting a crumbly cheeselike Blue
while scoopswork well for scoop-
ing Edam or Gouda.

SAVE YOUR XMAS

DURANGO, ROUND TOE

BOOTS
REG. S34.95

NOW 2595
BOYS EARTH

SHOES

ONLY $695

SEDGEFIELD NG

BIG BELL

DENIM

FACTORY 1 YEAR WARRANTY

REGo $17.00 $1100
NOW

STUDENT

BOYS LEVIS
BIG BELLS

REG. $16.00 SALE

BOYS 7 TO 14

REG, $12.50

$1250

$50
LEVI'S

BIG BELLS

REG. $16.00

$1050
NOW

LADIES

COATS & JACKETS

CLEARANCE

25 O OFF
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TEXAS PEACE CORPS volunteer
Mary Davis, 27, of Pep, works with
children at APAE northwest of Rio
de Janeiro, a Brazilian organiza-
tion helping mentally retarded.
Photo by Yves Gerem

MONEY

BOYS COWBOY

BOOTS

20c OFF

ALL BELTS

1

SEDGEFIELD

STUDENT SIZES

REG. S15.50

$1300
NOW I Q

BRUSHED DENIM BELL BOTTOMS

SLIMS & REGULARS

BOYS LEVIS
4 TO 8 9 TO 14 STUDENT

$595 $795 $995

ALL

TIES

25

OFF

OFF

ALL MENS WESTERN

BOOTS & HATS

10OFf

NEW
OWNERSHIP

DuncanMotor Service

Is Now

JA CKSON
Motor Service

AND IS OWNED BY

KennethJackson
WHO IS YOUR AUTHORIZED

Toro Dealer
WILL DO ALL TYPES OF SMALL ENGINE REPAIRS AND

HANDLES BRIGGS & STRATTON, TECUMSEH &

KOHLER ENGINES: AND LAWN MOWER ACCESSORIES.

ALSO SIDE ROW SPRINKLER ENGINES.

STORE HOURS

8:00 To 5:30 Monday Thru Friday

'iQZ-AO-
Kn 800 Tr 1 Oritur Jw inno ii nuuj iuju - .UIUUv ijc na avenue

SHOP

JANUARY CLEARANCE SALE
IN DECEMBER TO YOU FOR SHOPPING

AT THE
FAIR STORE

MENS

DRESS SLACKS
100 POLYESTER DOUBLE KNIT

REG. TO S16.00

ML MENS & BOYS

I Q

REG. S14.50

STUDENT

NOW

REG. S16.95 NOW

$12

JACKETS

SEDGEFIELD

12

OFF

50

LEVI JACKETS

UNLINED, 1295

BLANKET LINED, $0100
REG. $26.9i Z

BRUSHED DENIM

JACKETS

REG. $20.00

SALE

LITTLEFIELD

00

NOW

BY HAGGAR

$1A00

ALL

MEN'S SHIRTS

REDUCED

FIRST

ACME COWBOY

BOOTS
BUY

$4C00
STYLE 4656

MENS HI HEEL

DRESS SHOES
REGULAR

S20.95

REG. TO

REG. S13.95

REG.

S14.95

SI 2.95

S9.95

MENS WESTERN

SHIRTS

BOYS SEDGEFIELD

REG. S12.50

NOW

SHRINK TO FIT

LEVIS

REG.S12.25 95

3 FOR 2695

38" LENGTH 1050

CHILDRENS (GIRLS)

SHOES
ONLY

4

SPECIAL

95 AND $5

LEISURE

SHIRTS
REG. $12.95

Vi

$1695

8

SALE

S12.00

$10.00
S8.00

$1000

SUNDAY

PRICE
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RICE
M.J.B.,

42 OZ 59
BROILING

FOIL
REYNOLDS

LIC AA
DUTY, 9gQ

TAMALES
GEBHARDT'S,

PINESOL

15 OZ BOTTLE 07

S
4

CAN 3

l,l

i- i. , V V . ... li
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SAUJAGUDESNWITHA I
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' jMit m11 mmmwm l r 1 fWl&un l f
V PHOTOGRAPHER WILL BE IN OUR STORE 1 vlvrr"' WRIBRI A 'S--1

WED., DEC. 8 FROM Jf 'o p.m. V-k-
- I I lKKKBmtSM.'ml10 a.m. -- 8 i T 1

jail 3S N0 SIIB TO DMURS, HMtt K.. jjgsj&f JfV
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SHOULDER ROAST
BACON

vJMKBP

1 LBi T W 1"l

o

-il it

v

I

PRODUCE'

ARM R0AST ,98 POTATOES
TORTILLAS S029' "ccTET49? 0.2,10.0 Qf
HOG HEADS 29 1JL
BEEF TRIPE mEWU 34' fiRAPFFRUIT

JRYSPECIALS1 9 7
ULtO 1 LB AjQj TANUCKINEd ARIZONA, LB J
YELYEETA CHEESE $179 APPLESTorSr 3$l
MILKrouNnvsH..,en 79' ouo.$l57 CHRISTMAS NUTS

..".--i- ci an
WOWKM

COUPON

M -- v

DECKER, PKG

PARKAY, QUARTERS

HI fi iiiMiS WALNUTS

BRAZIL NUTS

HONEY DUNS MORTON, ?OZ DEAMITC

PIZZA 79JEN0513 12 0Z COCONUTS

COOL WHIP 9 0ZC.RTON 59' FLOUR GLADKHA.5 57'
D0NU15 59 SUGAR 99'MORTON'S, GLAZED BARREL, 5 BAG

OVEN CLEANER scented, CHILI

BAIIlKUUIVl IImUE 4 6 CUKN OUR DARLING, OR CS, 303 CAN

I
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lLMi.lnty

Vp

rrfniiTTn
KOUNTRY BOY

JOY

69
WITHOUT COUPON 89

Coupon Dec. 12

DISHWASHING DETERGENT

RICH READY

SPRAY-N-WAS- H

SPAGHEni SAUCE

wwffff??nCAKE MIXES
fafa&ufa&AMl '! 2 Mj&j&.j&.&.& ip inrrriM

KOUNTRY BOY

TIDE
KING SIZE

with rmiPON
$119

I

WITHOUT COUPON SI .43
I Coupon

W
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to.
w
VA

MiUr;

1

'N'

JMLKLS UREMinU

TEXAS RUBY LB IP C

I

LBBox

J7

LB

LB

LB

ROASTED, LB

1B.AG

JELLY OR SUGAR LB

lemon i6oz STYLE,

DELTA, ROLL PACK NO.

WITH

Good

fii

Good Dec. 12

&

RED,

EACH

RANCH 19 OZ

WK

CASCADE, AUTOMATIC,

FAMILY SIZE

BODEN'S, GALLON

16 0ZCAN

J,; RAGU,32 0Z

BETTY CROCKER, LAYER

GARDEN CLUB, QUART

PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU DECEMBER 8
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379'
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99' fSHSTsjtl
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FABRIC

FIRST QUALITY SPORTSWEARWEIGHT
SOLIDS AND YARN-DYE- D FANCIES.
BASIC AND FASHION COLORS.
58"60". FULL BOLTS.

COTTON MUSLIN

2 Yds.
For 99

UNBLEACHED 100
COTTON MUSLIN. GREAT
FOR QUILTS, CURTAINS,
ETC. 44'745, WIDE.

JCPenney
SUPPLEMENT TO:

Ploinview Doily Herald; levellond Son News; lomb County leader News;

lomeso Press Reporter, dovif News Journal; Partoles News Tribune

JltStfTTi'iiJT;!; ;7a .'irr; r : ;, ; rrrrrr
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M
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SEWING THREAD

SPOOLS FOR

ORIG. 49c EACH
ALL-PURPO- SE

POLYESTER THREAD IN

BASIC AND POPULAR
COLORS. 225
YARDS PER SPOOL.

99
- (Ss'

rcz " jj S

t

3

"i:

fnBllllBir P if " if W HT
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enney
Days

UPER CL0SE0UTS
FOR BOYS

SP0RTC0ATS

ORIG. M400TO$2000
NOW

$0
BOYS POLYESTER KNIT SPORTCOATS
IN ASSORTED SPRING COLORS.
ASSORTED STYLES. SIZES 8-2- 0;

REGULARS AND SLIMS.

LEISURE SUITS

ORIG. s19
NOW

00 $9
BOYS POLYESTER KNIT LEISURE SUITS
IN POPULAR COLORS. CONTRAST
STITCHING TRIM. SIZES 8-1- 8; REGULARS
AND SLIMS.

RESS SLACKS

BOYS POLYESTER KNIT DRESS SLACKS
IN ASSORTED SOLIDS. GREAT COLORS.
SIZES 8-1- 8; REGULARS AND SLIMS.

CHARGE IT! ! OR ASK ABOUT
OUR CONVENIENT LAY AWAY PLAN.

99

99



.as.

1 1 y?Ml ill

v r "- T Vk

--Sw mmmmWfjJs-!rf- '

l?W h55P rTrwiV iVB X

1II-J- H

mK $A

FRESH AND FLUFFY LOOKS FOR LITTLE 00GIRLS IN SHEERS, EMBROIDERIES, 59FLOCKED DOTS AND LACY TRIMS. ALL SPECIALAT 20 OFF.
-

REG. $1400
1-- 4T

$11
LACY PINAFORE STYLING OF POLYESTER
COTTON IN PINK, BLUE, OR YELLOW,
WITH WHITE. 1 --4 TODDLER SIZES.

REG. $1700

SHORT SLEEVE FLOCKED DOT IN PINAFORE
STYLE WITH RIBBON, EYELET, AND LACE
TRIM. BACK TIE SASH. IN BLUE, PINK, OR
YELLOW. SIZES 4-6- x.

99

SALE

SALE

GIRLS DRESS PUMP IN
PATENT VINYL.
SOLEAND HEEL. WHITE OR
BLACK IN SIZES VA --3 C.

ORIG. S4ANDS5

$13

20

60

GIRLS DRESSSHOES

COMPOSITION

GIRLS PURSES

CLOSEOUT 99 t

MANY ASSORTED STYLES AND
COLORS IN GIRLS PURSES FOR
TODDLERS, PRE-SCHOOLE-

AND SCHOOL AGE. FABRICS
AND PATENTS INCLUDED.

v

??

i

? --mMftm

31 i 1 Hi f ll

Si Mm V'tSk

HI

MENS FOUR-PIEC-E SUIT INCLUDES
BLAZER STYLED SPORTCOAT, 2 PAIR
OF SLACKS IN SOLID AND FANCY,
AND REVERSIBLE VEST. 100
POLYESTER IN ASSORTED COLORS.
SIZES 36 - 46.

MENS WESTERNSUIT

SPECIAL $59
MENS TWO-PIEC-E SUIT WITH
WESTERN STYLED JACKET
AND MATCHING SLACKS.
100 POLYESTER WITH
LEATHER-LOO-K FINISH. SIZE
38-4- 6.

(MENSWESTERN

$o99
MENS WESTERN SHIRTS OF

COTTON. SEVERAL STYLES
IN SOLIDS AND PRINTS. IN
SIZES 14'2 - 17; SLEEVES
32 - 35.
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ORIG. S1200TOS1600

NOW
$99

POLYESTER KNIT DRESS SLACKS IN
ASSORTED SOLIDS PATTERNS.
MANY FASHION COLORSTO CHOOSE
FROM. IN SIZES 30-4-2.

SHIRT CL0SE0UT:DRESS

ORIG. TO s1000 $Q99
MENS POLYESTER
COTTON DRESSSHIRTS
PRINTSAND SOLIDS.
LONG SLEEVE OR SHORT
IN ASSORTED COLORS.
SIZES 14'2-17- ;
SLEEVES32-3-4.

ABOUT OUR CONVENIfcN
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lj FOR I 99

MENS ACRYLIC DRESS
SOCKS IN BASIC AND
FASHION COLORS. ONE
SIZE FITS 10-1-3.
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MENS DRESSSOCKS

-

BOYS 3-P- c. VESTED SUITS

BOYS SIZES 4 TO 7

BOYS SIZES 10 TO 18

$18
$25

BOYS 100 POLYESTER SUITS WITH
SOLID COLOR JACKET AND PANTS.
ALSO REVERSIBLE SOLIDFANCY VEST
IN ASSORTED SIZES 4-- 7,

10-1- 8; REGULARSAND SLIMS.
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BOYS JEANS

99
BOYS NAVY DENIM JEANS

OF POLYESTERCOTTON.
ROUNDLEG, SLIGHTLY

FLARED. SIZES 8-1- 6;

SLIMS AND REGULARS.

BOYS SHIRTS

1 99
DRESS SHIRT PRINTSAND
cmirkcrCDnivccTCD
COTTON. ONE CHEST
POCKET. SIZES 8-- 1 8.
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YOUR CHOICE OFONE-O-R

TWO-PIEC- E GAUCHO SETSOF
POLYESTERNYLON. IN BLUE,
PEACH, SAND, OR MINT.
SIZES 5-1- 5.

GAUCHO BOOTS

SPECIAL $
GAUCHO BOOTS OF SMOOTH-FINIS- H

URETHANE. NYLONTRICOT LININGS.
ABOUT 15 IN. HIGH WITH FULL - LENGTH
SIDE ZIPPERS. 3 IN. HEELS. 5V2 - 9Va B.

1. .

JUNIOR JEANS

ORIG. $140

JUNIOR JEANS OR 100 COTTON AND
POYLERSTERCOTTON. IN PRE--W ASHED
DENIM AND UNWASHED FASHION COLORS.
SIZES 5-1- 5.
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CHARGE IT ! ! OR ASK ABOUT
OUR CONVENIENT LAY AWAY PLAN.'
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HOULDER BAGS

$4
CONTEMPORARY POLYURETHANE SHOULDER
BAGS IN CAMEL, TAN, BONE, WHITE, RUST,

AND BLACK. ASSORTED STYLES, ALL WITH
INSIDE POCKET.

y

FAMOUS NAME
BRAND PANTSUITSOF

100 POLYESTER IN
ASSORTEDSTYLES

AND COLORS. ALL

uas

MACHINE
WASHABLE.

SIZES 8-- 1 8.
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