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Littlefield showed savings of
$26,965,142, up $4,022,965 from last
year's $22,942,177. Loans were
$22,580,890, up $4,507,067 from last
year's $18,073,823.
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DON HUCKABEY, Littlefield fire
truck driver, comparesthe brandnew
Chevrolet fire truck with a 1947 model
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Lamb
County

By MURIEL LANDERS
ANTON-Saturd- ay, PresidentGer-

ald Ford laid aside his prepared
speechon military preparednessand
the economy, and spoke first to the
WestTexas StateUniversity students,

City Council to
The city council of Littlefield will

meet twice this week at 7 p.m. for

their regular meeting tonight, and at

12 noon Friday for a specially-calle-d

meetingto considerawardinga bid for

the 1976 streetseal coat program.
Tonight, the council will considersix

items on the agenda,besidesroutine
business of approving the minutes,
financial statementand departmental
reports.

In matters of old business, the
council will discuss an ordinanco

setting thewater and sewerextension
policy.

Cactus Square
Tho Cactus Square Restaurants,

composedof the SagebrushInn and
the Chapparral-forme- rly known as
the Dairy Mart-- are officially opening
their doorsunder a now name today,

accordingto Frank Sharp,owner.

Facilities and personnelwere given

a trial run Wednesdaynight, when

approximately80 girls from Girlstown,

U.S.A. and city, county, and business

FLOY RICHARDS, 75, end Lemuel

Wayne Richards, 48, were Injured

Wednesdaymorning whenthis pickup

veeredoff the left sideof Highway 385

mile north of Littlefield, and over-

turned. Floy Richards was driving

which revealed a net increaso of
$2,352,692.11 over last year's
$23,201,306.01. Loans and discounts
for the first quarter of this year are
$9,584,733.80, a net increase of
$1,017,515.63 over last year's

law itii i" i

Seagravespumper,which is going into
retirement.The new 1975 model truck
arrived Tuesday, and will update

commending them as students for
their returnto a belief in the American
ideals.

He said, "I haveagreat dealof faith
in the youngpeopleand what they are
going to do in the yearsahead.There

meet twice
New business matterswill include:
1. Appointment of members to the

Airport Zoning Board.
2. Appointment of members to the

PlanningCommission.
3. Discuss a letter from Terance

O'Rourke concerning natural gas
"banking deals".

4. Discussa letter from the Lubbock
Chamberof Commerceconcerningthe
southernroute for Amtrak.

5. Considera resolution supporting
the study to be done by the South
Plains Association of Governments
concerningjoint landfill operations.

opens today
executives were fed steaks in the
SagebrushInn.

According to Sharp, the Dairy Mart
franchise is being dropped and the
sign has been changed to the Chap-

arral.

Ribbon cutting ceremoniesand the
grand openingare scheduledfor May
7.

northward and when the accelerator
stuck, he reacheddown to pull it up
and lost control, according to DPS

patrolmen Cardinal and Williams.

(Pkotoby Joella Lovvorn

$18,621,000 in a rounded-of-f figure,
which reveals an increase of about
$2,979,140 over last year's
$15,641,860. Loans and discountsare
up $1,805,203, from $11,679,797 to
this quarter's figure of $13,385,000.
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is a stronger belief in America in the
young peopleof today, and there are
indications that the American free
enterprisesystemhaswhat appealsto
them."

Then he spoke of the improved
economy and lesseningof tensions in
the world. He said, "Twenty months
ago when I had the privilege of
becoming president, we were in a
periodof manyproblems.Many critics
were doomsayerswho said that we
were going to have a depressionlike
the 1930's. The American people did
not believe it. The American people
had more faith in themselves."

He emphasized, "I will never
promisemore than I can deliver and I

will deliver everything I promise." He
continued,"There is one basic truth I

believe in we should never forget
that a government bigenoughto give
useverythingwe want is big enoughto
take from us everything we have."

WestTexas StateUniversity student
body president, Paul Thomas, pre-

sided at the meeting, in the WTSU
Field House. The WT band and
Canyon High School bandperformeda
stirring rendition of "Hail to tho
Chief" asthe smiling, waving, relaxed
appearing Gerald Ford entered the
field house.A cheering,waving crowd
of over 3,000 with cameras flashing
stood andapplaudedseveralminutes.

Miss WTSU, Sheral Streckor, led
tho "Pledge to the Flag" and the
singing of tho "National Anthem".
WTSU PresidentLloyd I. Watkinswas
introduced by Canyon Mayor Manly

School Board
The Littlefield school board metin a

lengthy sessionMonday night.
Tho top agenda item was in-

surance on school buildings. Kelly

InsurancoAgency won the insurance
contract.The three-yea- r policy has an

annualpremium of $17,346.
The school calendarfor 1976-7-7 was

approved by a vote of 5-- 1. Doyle

Winfield cast the dissenting vote.
Studentswill start school Aug. 23 and
will get out of school May 20. The
students will enjoy an eight-da-y

Christmasvacationand will again be
out threedays for Easter.

After canvassingthe votes, Doug

Walden and David Hampton were
sworn in asboardmembers.Hampton
was elected as board president and
Dick Hopping vice president.

A marathonone-ho- twenty-three-minu-

executivesessionsaw Richard
Ingram receive a $300 raise and
CarletonParkera $600 increase.

field reported deposits totaling
$8,531,641.73, up $1,072,062 from last
year's figure of $7,459,579. Loans and
discounts are up $215,077, or from
$1,978,188 in 1975 to this year's
$2,193,265.26.

Citizens StateBank of Earth showed
depositsof $8,325,000, up $1,683,302
from lastyear's$6,641,698. Loans are
up $l,762,519-fro- m $4,194,481 in
1975 to this year's$5,957,000.

The First NationalBank of Amherst
showed first quarter deposits of
$7,759,000, up $391,222 from last
year's deposits of $7,367,778. Loans
are up $100,000-fr- om $1,355,000 to
$1,455,000.

Bicentennial
plans continue

Leader-New-s

Anton woman hearsPresident

Organizations and individual citi-

zensof Littlefield are busy preparing
their portion of the giant April 30-M-

1 BicentennialCelebration estimated
to be the best ever for this city.

Prize tickets are now on sale,and a
parade,barbecues,dances,art show,
fiddling contest,kiddy carnival,voting
primaries, and grand openings for
severalbusinessesareplannedfor the
specialdays.

All activities, which are usually
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Bryan who expressedhis pleasureof
welcoming the first active Presidentof
the United Statesto Canyon.

WTSU President presented Presi-

dent Ford to an enthusiasticaudience.
SenatorJohn Tower, the president's
Texascampaignchairman,was also a
platform guest.

After President Ford's opening
remarks,he openedthe questionand
answer session. The first question
came from a young boy who asked,
"We understandthat Mrs. Ford has a
new CB radio. What's her handle?"
which met with laughter by both the
president and audience. His answer
was that shehadnot decideduponher
"handle," but he was sure that
whatever sho decided was what it
would be.

The sessionbecamemore serious
when he responded to a question
about thenew book, Final Days. He
saidthat he hadnot readthe book, but
"It appearsfrom what I have heard
that it is reasonably accurate." He
continued,"In some ways I am a little
saddenedby the publication of the
book. I am not surethat it is good to go
back through that tragic period
again."

In responseto a questionabout the
Burleson-Curti-s estate tax bill, he
assertedthat he fully recognizedthe
necessity for an increase in the
exemptionin the estatetax becauseof
the problemsthat are arising for the
small businessand farmowners. He
said that he hasproposedan increase

See PRESIDENT, Page2

buys insurance
All board members were present

except for Hopping.

Littlt Dribbltrs

begin playoffs

Littlefield and fourother teamswill
collide in the West Texas Playoffs of
Major League Little Dribblers at
Levelland this week. The tournament
began Wednesdayand runs through
Saturday.

Littlefield opened the tournament
Wednesdayby meeting Sudan. The
winnerof that gamewill play Plainsat
12:45 p.m. Thursday. Idalou and
Seymour are also entered in the
double eliminationtourney.

The championshipgame is set for 7

p.m. Saturday.

had deposits of $5,400,496.03,com-
pared to last j ear's deposits of
$4,879,637--a net increase of
$520,859. Loans and discounts are up
$184,811 from $1,202,309 for 1975 to
$1,387,120.11 for this year.

Citizens State Bank of Anton
showed depositsof $4,690,913.47,up
$760,240 from last year's report of
$3,930,673. Loans and discountsare
up $280,773-fr- om $1,903,144 to
$2,183,917.47 for this year.

Savingsand Loan Asso-

ciation of Littlefield has no records to
specify Lamb County deposits and
loans.

associatedin August with Littlefield
Festivities Days, havebeen combined
into one giant program to help the
nation celebrateits 200th birthday.

According to parade
HershellRandall andSusanHead,the
parade for Saturday morning "is
shapingup nicely".

Among the groupsin the paradewill
be the color guard from the Marine
Corps of Lubbock; a mobile combat
unit from the Marines, the recruiting
vans from the Marine Corps and the
Navy; a drill team of Seacadetswith
their colors; two model ships provided

See BICENTENNIAL, PAGE 2

Prize tickets
now on sale

Prize tickets arenow on sale for the
hugeApril 30-M- 1 Littlefield Bicen-

tennial Celebration, and may be
purchased form members of several
organizationsandthe ticketchairman,
Marty Mangum.

According to Mangum, salesof the
10,000 tickets began this week, and
4,000 of them havebeendistributed to

. the various groups in town. Other
groups who are interested in selling
the tickets may call Mangum at
385-513- 1, "They will receive 10 per-
cent of their total sales," Mangum
advised.

To date, only 200 havebeensold.
For a SI donation to Bicentennial

Days and expenses,persons have a
chance atwinning a trip for two to
Boston for four daysand three nights;
or two CB radios.

A prize will be given to the
individual selling the most tickets.

'Miss Lamb County'

Pageant postponed

until June 5th

The 'Miss Lamb County" Pageanthas
been for June 5 instead
of during the BicentennialDays Cele-

bration as originally planned.
Due to too many conflicting student

activities, the event is postponedto
the later date.

Personswishing to enter are asked
to contact Kris Bean at 385-461- 8 or
Kyra Cox at 385-464- 9.

The contestis sponsoredby Tau Chi
Chapterof BetaSigma Phi.

All contestants mustbe single and
never have been married. They must
be 17 yearsold by July 1, andno older
than 22 on July 1.

DANIEL ALVARADO has moved to
Littlefield from Seymour to become
patrolman for the Texas Department
of Public Safety. He has just com-
pleted recruit school and he and his
wife, Frances, have one daughter,
Patricia, 4 years old. Staff Photo
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(Continued From Page l)
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by the Navy, including "Old Iron-
sides" and an aircraft carrier; the
army recruiting van from Plain view;
an Air Force ROTC detachment from
Texas Tech, "Angel Flight", com-pose- d

of women; antique cars; new
modern farm machinery; open cars
with the parademarshal!,"Miss Lamb
County"", and others; three bands
from the Littlefield schools,five riding
clubs, including the Lamb County
Sheriff's Posse;a float from the Lions
Clubs; float sponsoredby the three
chapters of Beta Sigma Phi; and an
entry by the AARP (retired persons).

Other entries are expected to be
included,andpersonsor organizations
wishing to have their organizations
listed are askedto contactone of the
two

Each organizationsellingticketswill
receive10 percentof thegross.Tickets
are a onedollar donation each. For
further information contact Marty
Mangum.ticket sales chairman,or the
Chamberof Commerce office.

Preliminaries to Saturday's events
are to begin April 29 when the
Littlefield Circle Eight SquareDance
Club hosts a Bicentennial square
dance in the new County Agriculture
and Community Building.

Paintingsandotherart forms will be
on display duringthe weekendin the
Community Building. Dee Dee Davis
and SarahTollett are chairmenof the
art show.

At leasttwo events,a museumanda
fiddler's contest, are still in the
planning stages.

The barbecue,sponsoredby all the
Littlefield bands, will feature enough
barbecueto feed the entire population
of Lamb County. Tableswill be set up
under the trees in LaGuna Park and
the three Littlefield bands will enter-
tain during mealtimes.

The steering committee for the
Littlefield BicentennialCelebration in-

cludes Hubert Henry. Tom Tollett,
Benny Zahn. Paul Carmickle, Carol
Black, SarahTollett, Marty Mangum,
Bill Adams and Randall.

president
from the $60,000 exception up to
$150,000 which would be phased in
over a period of five years.
, Concerning the possibility of a
National Health Insurance Program,
Mr. Ford said that he preferred to use
thepresenthealthinsuranceprograms
to develop an improved program
rather than the federal government
taking over all health insurance.
"However." he said, "Concerning
catastrophicillnesses, "It is my feel-

ing that Medicade and medicare
should be implementedto cover such
financially devastatingcrises."

One of the subjectswhich interested
the Canyon audiencemost was con-

cerning President Ford's farm pro-

gram. He said he is pleasedwith the
current program and proposes to
improve on it He said, "I think it is
good for America.

In answerto the questionwhich had
followed him acrossTexas regarding
the possibility of John Connally for
Vice President,Mr Fordsaid that first
he had to be nominated before he

c OBITUARIES
OSCAR LEE BAKER

Oscar Lee Baker, 67. former area
resident, died in Fort Worth Monday,
April 5, at his home

Funeralserviceswereheld from the
Anderson-Clayto- n Chapel of Kemp
Wednesdayafternoon with Rev. Tho-
mas Potterofficiating.

Intermentwas in the Guthrie Ceme-
tery.

Oscar Lee Baker was born in
Henderson County, Jan. 19, 1909.
He lived in the Styx Com-

munity severalyears and later moved
to Stamfordandhadbeena residentof
Fort Worth the past two and one half
years.

He is survived by his wife, Mrs.
Florence MarieBakerof Forth Worth;
two sons,Howard Lee Baker and Jess
VV'llliard Baker ofFt. Worth; two daugh-
ters. Ethel Marie Bakerof Fort Worth
andGloria Helen Cooper of Littlefield;
four brothers,J. D. Baker, Billy Baker
of Dallas, J. C Bakerof Kaufman, E.
D. Rich of California; two sisters,
Lucille Dixon of Kemp, Kizzie Rice of
Garland; seven grandchildren; and
severalniecesand nephews.

JOHN EDWARD LAIR
Funeral services for John Edward

Lair, 66, of Anton, who died at 12:25
a m. Wednesdayin Littlefield Hospi-
tal, are scheduledfor 2 p.m. Friday in
First Baptist Churchof Anton.

Officiating will be Rev. Truitt
White, pastor, and Rev. Russell
McAnally of First United Methodist
Churchof Merkel.

Burial will be in the Anton Cemetery
with Hammons Funeral Home in
chargeof arrangements.

Lair was bornApril 4, 1910at Honey
Grove andhad lived at Anton 27 years.

could choose a running mate. Thenhe
added, "There are many outstanding
Republicans,including Senator John
Tower, who would make a good vice
president."

A lady askedhim to list the qualities
of a good leader. He said that a good
leaderfor our countryshould bo: (1) A

person in public life has to be honest
with himself andfrank with the people
he represents.(2) A leadermust have
a basic intelligence. (3) He must have
an experiencedbackground, (4) He
mustbe ableto make decisions.When
one seesthe kind of problems that
come acrossthe President's desk,he
must decide "Yes" or "No" there
can be no "Maybes". (5) He must
have constructive ideas for solving
problems.Just to say what is wrong is
not enough.

In responseto a question, What do
you think about the concept of
winning?" Mr. Ford said that he had
competedall of his life. He continued,
"Competition is good, but it has to be
fair. It stimulates men to do more."
He said, "It is also good for Americans
to competewith other countries." He
addedthat since he had competedin
sports,hehad long ago learnedhow to
win and how to lose.

The President reminded his
audience that he had recommended
decontrol of oil and natural gas to
stimulate the production of these
energy sources. Congress passed a
modified oil control bill, but did
nothingaboutnaturalgas.He saidthat
our domesticuseof oil is down about2

percent since 1973, and got a laugh
when he said that it was becausethe
peopledrove slower. He proposedan
expenditureof 160 million dollars for
next year to be used in researchon
solar and other energyresearch.

PresidentFord concludedhis visit to
Canyon by shakinghandswith people
both inside and outside the Field
House. During the time he was in
Canyon, the street in front of the Field
House was barricaded and traffic
routed around the college area.
Securitywas very tight and many law
enforcement officers from the DPS,
Randall and Potter Counties sheriff's
departments. Canyon and Amarillo
police aided with the crowd control.

One gToup of college students had
their sack of beer confiscatedby the
Randall County sheriff.

Media coveragewas very thorough
since many had come with the
presidential party on Air Force One.
Radio, TV, andnewsmenand women,
including a newsman from Reuters,
filled a large areareservedfor them.

The Presidentexpressedhis appre-
ciation for the fine reception he had
received in Texas where he says he
considershimself to be an underdog.
He said he brought a message to
WTSU from Miami, Fla.-T- hey

thanked him for sending them Mer-
cury Morris,

The trip was classified as political,
but for the thousandsof people who
were able to see and hear the
Presidentof the United Statesit was a
memorable occasion. It is no small
thing to be presenta few feet from the
speaker's platform and hear bands
begin playing Ruffles and Flourishes
and hear the announcement,"Ladies
andGentlemen The Presidentof the
United States!" Television or film just
can not comparewith the real thing!

He married Jewell Booker Sept. 25,
1937 in Bonham. He was a retired
mechanic

Surviving are his wife; two daugh-
ters, Mrs. Doyle Butler of Anton and
Mrs. Gene Evans of Arlington; a step-
daughter, Mrs. Charles Thomas of
Riverside, Calif.; two sisters, Mrs. J.
C. Eubanksof Bonham andMrs. H. B.
Lovel! of Fort Worth; six brothers,
Varlie Lair, Elmer Lair, Welford Lair,
George Lair and Mortie Lair, all of
Honey Grove, and Jack Lair of
Bonham; nine grandchildren and 6

BOB THOMPSON
Services for Bob R. Thompson,45,

of Big Spring, were conducted Mon-
day afternoon in Nalley-Pick- Rose-
wood Chapel with Jerry Yarbrough,
minister of the 14th and Main St.
Churchof Christ, officiating.

Burial was in Trinity Memorial
Park.

Thompsondied at 7:52 p.m. Satur-
day, April 10, in a Big Spring hospital
after a lengthy illness.

Born in Motley County, Thompson
was a resident of Big Spring since
1973. He married LaNell Moore there
Nov. 23, 1973.

He was a truck driver for P. and R.
Transport of Coahoma and was a
former marine.

Survivors include his wife of the
home; three daughters,Reneeof the .

home, Mrs. Linda Russell of Clarks-vill- e,

Tenn. and Mrs. Tommy Harendt
of Lubbock; two step-son-s, Rex Moore
of the home and Ricky Moore of
Anton; his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Thompsonof nig Spring; ono brother,
Kenneth Thompson of Matador; his
grandmother, Mrs. Annie Thompson

)
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Easter cookery 02
fancy and &. aotntious,

says Mrs. Mary Se;. fcods and
nutrition specialist

"The family's favorite recipes, pro-
viding a meal, can be
decoratedor garnisheda bit to create
a fancy Easter feast," she said.

Mrs. Sweeten is with the Texas
Agricultural Extension Service, The
TexasA&M University System.

"Set the scene by decorating the
table with spring flowers, customary
bunnies and chicks, and decorated
Eastereggs for the centerpiece.Then
the eggscan be used the next day in
dishessuchas egg cutlets or creamed
eggson toast.

"And the nutritional centerpiece
eggsalso canbe madeinto hot deviled
egg in cream sauce, cheese fondue,
potatoessouffle, scallopedham, eggs
andpotatoesand vegetable-eg-g cas-
seroles," she added.

For ladies' salad luncheon during
the Easter season,the specialistsug-
gested this attractive plate. Potato
salad,a tomato wedge,cooked chilled
broccoli with a peppy dressing and
assorted sandwich quarters with a
bowl of French onion soup. Use a
moldedginger ale fruit saladwith half
a banana rolled in chopped nuts
garnishedwith a fresh strawberry for
dessert,she added.

Another suggestionfor Eastersalad
is cottage cheese in the center of a
plate of watercress,surrounded with
gelatin, eggs and deviled eggs. Nut
bread sandwicheswould be a good
accompanimentto this plate.

"A gelatin ribbon saladwith layers
of cooked green peas, diced raw
celery, diced cooked celery and sliced
hard cooked eggs satisfiesnutritional
requirements andtastesgood too,"
shesaid.

Children will enjoy a "make be-

lieve" fried egg for dessert. Place a
peachround on a slice of plain cake
and surround it with whipped cream.
Or candyEastereggson iced cupcakes
will be favoritestoo. Also, chiffon pies
in pastelcolors are a light dessertthat
would be suitable if the meal was
especiallyrich, Mrs. Sweetensaid.

"Another fancy dessertis a butter-
fly cake.Cut a roundlayercako in half.
Turn the layers so that the cut side is
on the outside, Ice the cake and then
decoratewith chocolatechips, shaved
chocolate and colored frosting for a
glamorousbutterfly," shesaid.

She suggestedthat children would
love a bunny cako. Make the face on
the roundcake andcut the earsout of
the secondround layer. Use colored
coconut or jellied candiesto decorate
the eyes, nose and mouth and use
toothpicks for whiskers.

NOW THAT THE NEW BEEF
grading standardsare in effect, con-
sumers probably are wondering how
the quality of beef they buy will be
affected.

"The taste, tenderness and juici-
ness of beef, as well as the cost,
should remain the same,"saysFrank
Brooks, meat specialistwith the Texas
Departmentof Agriculture.

Brooks points out that beef will

of Globe, Ariz, and onegrandson.
Pallbearerswill be Kenneth Green,

Rufus Parks, Gary Bradberry, Bill
Lane, Collin Reeceand Manuel Rubio.
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continue to be graded according to
tenderness and taste. In addition,
grading will continue to be voluntary
and inspection will continue to be
mandatory.

The new standardshave resulted in
four changes.

First, all beef must be graded for
both quality and yield. Before, beef
could begradedfor eitheror both. The
quality gradeswill remain thesame-Pri- me,

Choice, Good, Standard,Com-
mercial, Utility, Cutter and Canner.

Yield grades, numbering from 1 to
5, indicate how much saleable meat
can be taken from a carcasswith the
most useablemeat available from the
lower yield grades.

Second, the minimum amount of
marbling specified will be thesamefor
cattle between9 and 30 monthsold.

As a result, slightly leanerbeef will
qualify for U. S. Prime and Choice.
Previously, increased marbling was
required to compensatefor increased
ageof cattle.

Third, the U. S. Good grade has
been changed to include lean but
relatively tender beef.

Fourth, carcass shapes will no
longer be a factor in determining the
quality grade.

LAMB IS A SPECIAL springtime
entree.Whenthe occasion calls for an
eleganttouch, Roasted Leg of Lamb is
the answer, according to the Texas
Departmentof Agriculture home econ-
omist.

Moist, tender, flavorful and easy to
prepare, it's sure to be a winner with
guests.Lamb sold in this country must
be less than one year old; therefore,
the meat is tender andcan be cooked
by dry heat methodssuch as broiling,
pan-broili- and roasting.

ROASTED LEG OF LAMB
Mr cup butter
Juice of 3 lemons
1 'i tsp. Worcestershiresauce
1 tsp. dry mustard
1 tsp. MSG
3 Tbsp, cooking oil
3 bay leaves
1 tsp. garlic salt
Pepperto taste
1 leg of lamb

about5 pounds
Combine all ingredients except

lamb. Bring to a boil; remove from
heat and cool. Place lamb in a Dutch
oven and sprinkle with salt. Pour
butter mixtureover lamb and marinate
in refrigerator for 12-2- 4 hours. Bake
uncoveredat 450 for 1', hours.

Decreasetemperature to 350
andcontinueto bake until done,

(Allow 30 to 35 minutesper pound for
roasting.) Meat thermometerwill er

175 degreesfor mediumand 180
degrees for well done. Garnish with
parsley and cracked pepper. Yield- - 6
to 8 servings.

CHOCOLATE-COVERE-
candy has

beenaroundonly a little more than a
century.

The Chocolate ManufacturersAsso-ciatio- n

of the U.S.A. says it was
"vented in, 1870 by a confectioner

trying to increase sales of candvcreams. The chocolate coating madethe candieshold togetherbetter
Originally, they were

but by 1900 the French hJtavXd
machineto do the work.

a

'THE ABUNDANT LIFE1

Reassurances

THERE ARE MANY WAYS we can
help each other, and, at tho same
time, help ourselves.One of tho most
helpful of these ways is In tho
"reasurrances"we givo to ono an-

other.
"Reassurances"from us to others is

a double-prof- it action. We strengthen
ourselvesand them.

WE ENCOURAGE OTHERS by
reassuringthem; the loan they carry
will seem little lighter; and they will

be upbuilded. We should know how

much "reassurances" are needed by
others, becausewe know how much
they mean to us.

Uusually, such action will not stop
with us and those to whom our words
andactions are reassuring.This Is tho
kind of pcople-to-peop- help that
spreads.Most of us who receive such
help will passit on.

OUR CONFIDENCE will grow from

the "reassurances" we receive from

our fellowmen; andwe canstrengthen
the confidence of the peoplo whoso
lives we touch by reassuringthem. "If
1 had anythingto give people, I would
given them confidence."

THE NEED for confidence that
comes from "reassurances"begins
early in one's life. The child deprived
of this help must surely be one of the
most underpriviledged.

It is cruel to say or do things to
destroythe confidenceof a child, and
it is just aboutas harmful to withhold
the "reassurances"children need.

IN ORDER TO DO WELL, we must
fully appreciatethe need for and the
value of "reassurances" for all
people; of all ages; and in all
circumstances.All of us need reas--

H5MNYGW5
By COKN'RALL BLEVINS

WOULDN'T WANT to take undue
credit, but I'd had a rain gaugelayin'
aroundthe housefor quite a few days.
Sunday at 4:15 I decided I'd just as
well put the thing up.

By 5:15 it'd startedsprinkling rain.
In another 15 minutes it was raining
like we hadn't seenin a long time. At
7:15 I went out to check the thing,
finding a good nine-tenth- s of rain in it,
and still raining Now that's what I

call action!

DON'T KNOW WHETHER that had
anything to do with the deluge they
got up aroundOlton or not, but if the
rain gets too heavy and you'll let me
know, I'll take that gauge down and
put it back in the house!

I SEE WHERE we may all be
coming nearer to being eligible for
food stamps than we may have
thought.They way it reads,a family of
four, makinglessthan $458 per month
will be eligible.

Which doesn't seem so bad, until
you take into consideration, that the
S458 is net income. Thus it becomes
possiblefor a pretty substantial wage
earner to qualify, depending on his

Turn

Row

THE RAINS HAVE COME--so did
the hail-b- ut at least wet weather has
arrived. It is somewhatuncommonto
receive April showersin April. Guess
the only advice I can give to you
farmerson this wet weather is not to
get too anxious about planting this
early. We ain't seennothing yet as far
asweather is concerned.

'
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Citizens of the Amherst communitywho
he

areinterestedin makingplans for
Amherst BicentennialCelebrationare aaked to attend a specialmeetingta the Amherst High School LibraryTuesday,April 20, at 7 p.m.

scheduledare

Pressthem at this meeting
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flattery is meaningless,and fi
is cruel and defeating
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LOOKS LIKE if they keep 1

on the thing, they re going t

majority of us covered So, ii
gonna pay the billr'

WOULDN'T IT be race if cl
take all the best promises to i

presidential hopefuls, and put ij
into operationin one man

WHICH BRINGS to mind it
sticker I noticed awhile back
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21 womenfrom 11 counties attend District THDA meet
the Foundation of

theme for the
Let 2 Chapter of tho

Home Demonstration

ion annual spring
held in the uwid

Ipiculture and Com

munity Building, where 221
Homo Demonstration women
from 17 countiesgathered for
the general assembly.

Namebadges provided
by tho Littleficld Chamberof
Commerce

ifaisiri
SagebrushInn

1010 W. 10th

roe Th

FINEST STEAKS

In Littlefield &

The Area.

We're Open And

Ready To Serve You.

1 HHBHHHHHBHHBHHKMfciiiiii

mffS

were

kam
708 W. Delano

385-44- 89

ED JENNINGS,
Agency Mgr.

Texas farm Bureau
Insurance Companies

IITTIECICin I

SERVICE CENTER
KELVINATOR

5yUfANlA
ni 'jQ;'imwww w uciuiiw f w n

ServiceOn All MaiorBrands

enntnfi
DIAL 385-516-6 FOR

CATALOG SHOPPING

408 Phelps 385-516- 6

SAVlNOtJAHD LOAK

JT Littlefield
VI Office

J

410 LFD Drive

Ph. 385-51- 49

LITTLEFIELD

CLEANERS

DRY CLEANING

BY PROFESSIONALS

303 W 4th 385-463-3

J

Featuredspeaker
County Judgo Kirby of
Littleficld.

Judge Kirby's speech
on the meaning of

A
memberof a pioneerCollings--

ehhc .jflfellHI

LITTLEFIELD'S new Highway Patrol,

Daniel Alvarado, is shown with
man.

Pat, andwife
his daughter.

Frances. The Alvarados recently

moved here from Seymour. are

members of the Catholic Church.

These Littlefield merchantswelcome

the Alvarados to our

Littlefield
Super Market

Double

GunnBro. Stamps

Tues. & Wed.

819 E. 4th

Lamb
Ruth

E

linnp

They

town.

385-34- UU

Utttlefield GardenCenter

Ditching Service

NurseryStock

385 Southand84

Call

m
?Zlifr.. jut-- .

was

bicentennial celebrations.

worth family and a Littlefield
resident slnco 195G, she en-

tered the Texas Tech Law
School when it openedin 1967
and graduatedin 1970 with a
Doctor of Jurisprudence de-

gree, ranking first in her class.
She joined tho TexasTech law
faculty where sho taught for
five years. During tho summer
of 1973 she was a visiting
professorat the University of
TexasSchool of Law in Austin.

Before receiving her legal
education, she worked as an
administrativesecretary,legal
secretaryand a public school
teacher.

Also here for the annual
meeting were Mrs. Charles
Warminski, state THDA trea-

surer of White Deer; Mrs.
Lucille Witten, District 2

THDA director, from Plain-vie- w

and Mrs. Catherine
Crawford, District 2 Extension
Agent (Home Economics) of
Lubbock.

Amherstwomen

attend UMW

conference
AMHERST-T- he annual

United Methodist Women's
conference was held in the
Polk Street Methodist Church
of Amarillo April 7--8.

The Amherst UMW was
representedat the meeting by
Mrs. Jomeryl Harmon, Mrs.
Norman Patton, Mrs. R. II .

CampbellandMrs. JoeMiller.
The president, Mrs. H. H.
Stephensof Big Spring pre-

sided.
The theme was "Service

through love."
The main speakerwas Miss

Juanelava Rose of Tulia who
teachesat a collegein Taiwan.
She majored in music and
played seven different instru-
ments from there.

The two-day- s and a night
programs were of inspiration
to all attending. Severaltapes
weremadeof various numbers
on the program.

To

Littlefield

1M

Likable, Livable

s&s. Ty3Kni

BEBhys
LAUNDRY

Jr CAR-WA-
SH

io4h t xtr

ICE CUBEO k
BLOCK

House
Of Beauty

Our Specialty

Is To PleaseYou

711 Hall Ave. 385-52- 83

THE ORIGINAL

TASTY TACO

SERVING THE FINEST

IN MEXICAN, AMERICAN

AND SEA FOODS

621 Hall Ave. 385-37- 64

Mrs. Witten presided over
the morning sessions. The
colors were presentedby Boy
Scout Troop No. 641. Mrs.
Doris Waters, Lamb County
THDA chairman from Little-
field led the pledge to the
flags. The invocation was by
Rev. Benny Goss, pastor of
Sunset Avenue Baptist
Church, Littlefield.

Jim Settle, member of
Chamber of Commerce and
Board of City Development
and Mrs. Ruth Miller, Okla-

homa Avenue Homo Demon-

stration Club member from
Littlefield gave the welcome
on behalf of the Lamb County
Club women.

Mrs. Lorene Hulse, a mem-
ber of the Oklahoma Avenue
Home DemonstrationClub
played the piano.Stilwell Rus-
sell, Victory Choir Director of
Littlefield First Baptist
Church, led singing.

4-- members pm Lamb
County who servedsushers
are Petra Lewis of Earth and
Dan Foley of Littlefield.

A noon luncheonwas served
at the Community andAgricul-
tural Building.

The afternoon program,
which featured three work-

shops on safety, health, re-

creation andcultural arts also
include election of officers, a
messagefrom the stateTHDA
Board, presentation of the
1976 THDA academic scho-

larship winner and a business
session.

The workshop, which began
at 1 p.m., included discussions
on safety measures to take
during tornadoweather,useof
blood for therapeuticpurposes
and a presentationon quilting
in which homemakers will
participate.

In the group session on
safety, Dr. E. W. Kiesling of
the Department of Civil En-

gineering at Texas Tech Uni-

versitydiscussed researchthat
had beenconductedon move-

ment of tornadoes andon
shelters.

Mrs. Nancy Adams,medical
technologistat the Brownfield
General Hospital in Brown-fiel- d,

presented information
on the functionof blood and its

t
therapeutic uses during the
health workshop. And in the
cultural arts session,two home
demonstration club members
gave a talk on the art of
quilting. Club members de-

monstratedhow to make yarn
flowers.

Concluding the day-lon-g

annual meetinc were nn- -

K nouncementsof officer elec--

tions. Both Hockley andCastro

gR County invited the women to
3fij their county for the 1977

annual meeting. The decision
1301 on the location will be made

later.
Mrs. Janie Hallett of Lub-

bock County was electedasthe
new District 2 THDA director.
Shewill takeoffice in January.

The Home Demonstration
Club women expressed their
appreciationto the merchants
who helped with the courtesy
packetsand door prizes.

LITTLEFIELD: Pazaz,

GIPSON

Speaker
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Armes Equipment Co.,
Carlisle-Oldha- Ford, Duncan
Motor Servlco, Littleficld Bu-

tane Co., Littlefield Super
Mkt., Roy Reid Tire and
Supply, Bawcom Butane Co.,
Byers Feed andGrain, Farm
EquipmentCo., First National
Bank of Littlefield, Good pas-
ture, Inc., I.S.C. Securities
Co., Kelly Ins. Agency, Tide
Products, Inc., Joy's Hair
Designers, Connell's Office
Supply, Gene Hanlin Auto,

CrescentPart Motel, Ham-

mond's Funeral Home, Jim
Jones Conoco, Security State

EngagementW

announced
OLTON-- Mr. and Mrs. Ray

Culwell announcethe engage-
ment and approaching mar-

riage of their daughter, Susan
Donice, to Joe Dale Chitwood,
son of Mr. and Mrs. Dale
Chitwood.

Plansare being made for a
June 25 wedding in First
United Methodist Church.
Friends and relatives are in-

vited.
The bride-elec- t, a graduate

of Olton High School, is cur-

rently a student at South
PlainsCollege, Levelland.

Chitwood, also an Olton
graduate,holds a degreefrom
TexasA&M University, and is
presently studyingthe Dental
Branch of the University of
Texasat Houston.

TAKE HEARING TEST
People who complain of a

constant ringing in their ears
may be displayingone sign of
a hearing loss, and should
havea hearing test.

Bank, Pay n' Save, Tri Co.
Savings and Loan, B & C

Pump and Machine, Brittain
Pharmacy, Farm Bureau,
Keithley and Co., Lamb
County Abstract Co., Little-

field Farmers Co-o-p, Earnest
Mills.

F. L. Newton Insurance,
Rowe Abstract and Title Co.,
Southwestern Public Service,
Newton's Ladies Apparel,
Armes Chevrolet Co., Camp-

bell's Plbg., City Beauty
Salon, Cox Tin and Plumbling,
Dairy Queen, Federal Land
Bank, G & C Auto Supply,

fHlhL riBHr

CHARLOTTE WHITE

Couple sets

ivedding date

Marie Whiteof Littlefield an-

nouncesthe engagementand
approaching marriage of her
daughter, Charlotte, to Jeff
Nichols, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Lawrence Nichols.

A May 8 wedding is being
plannedin Colonial Apartment
Number five.

Re-ele-ct A. Peel
Commissioner Of

Precinct 3
I, JackA. Peel, am seeking

to the office of Commissionerof
Precinct 3. I would appreciate your

'" continued support. It has been a
priviledge and an honor to have
served the people of Precinct 3 and
Lamb County. If I will
continueto serveoneandall the same
regardlessof race,creed,or color.

I have lived in Lamb County all my
life except for three years I served in
the U.S. Army.

I worked sevenyears for the county
as a maintenance operator before
going in to farming. I have served
sevenyearsas County Commissioner.
With this experience,I feel I am fully
qualified to serve as your Com-
missionerof Precinct3.

My wife, Pearl,and I havetwo sons,
Bruce who is married and is now
attending TexasTech, and Kenny, a
seniorat Littlefield High School.

We areactivemembersof Parkview
Baptist Church, and currently I am

SERMON TOPICS

Sundaymorning JESUS IS LORD
Sunday Nlght-T- HE BOOK
OF REVELATION
Monday Nlght-BLO- OD THAT TALKS
TuesdayNigh- t- GOD WANTS TO SAVE YOU
WednesdayNight-CHR- IST AND THE
CHURCH
Thursday Nlght-WH- EN THE TRUMPET
SOUNDS

STORIES FORTHE CHILDREN:

SundayNlght-T- HE KING'S BIRTHDAY
Monday Nlght-T- WO BAD BOYS

TuesdayNlght-PA- UL AND THE SNAKE
WednesdayNlght-T- HE BOY WHO WENT
TO SLEEP IN CHURCH
ThursdayNlght-T- HE FIERY FURNACE

Lackey'sAppliance,
Nelson's True Value Hard-

ware, Pat's Record Store,
Powell's Upholstery, Rodens
Drug, Shook Tire, Virgies

Beauty Bar, Winston In-

surance Agency and Wares
DepartmentStore.

OLTON: Howell's Flowers
Shop,Chamberof Commerce,
PioneerNaturalGas Co., Sher-

man's Ins. Agency, Northside
Gift Shop, Olton State Bank,

Sluder's Ins. Agency. Thomp-

son Chevrolet,
Olton Auto Parts,Thompson

John Deer, Shamrock Station
Olton Feed Barn, Hall's Lum

ber Yard, Olton Coop Gin

Olton FarmSupply,StrawGin

Walker Texico, Guy Martin
Welding, McClains T V.

Frontier Savings and Loan
Olton Enterprise.

EARTH: Chem-Te-x. Spring
lake Co-o-p Gin, Pioneer Na

tural Gas-Eart- Southwestern
Public Service-Eart- h.

f Ladles Waltz
GOWNS

Cotton & j
I Blend, I

f Reg. $3.99

w!iiC3HflH.&flkftjB

JACK A. PEEL

serving as of the Deacon
Body, Training Union Director and a
churchtrustee.

"Let's keep working together for a
better community." Your vote and
influence will be appreciatedMay 1,
1976.

Thank you,
JackA. Peel

GOSPEL MEETING

12777

(SiBsoysj

CRESCENT PARK CHURCH OF CHRIST
Littlefield, Texas

APRIL 18-2- 2

SERVICES 10 A.M. & 7:30 P.M.

NORMAN

LEADER-NEWS- , LITTLEFIELD,

Jack

ENCOURAGING

Polyester

:

ad paid by Jack Peel

1

ALVIS JONES

Song Director
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trusteesrenew contracts
ANTON-T- he Board of

Trustees of Anton lndepen--

I

HB

0 0 0 0

dent School accepted
the of Mrs.

g 4 000
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Pick of the crop. top mergesto the

lor a super Vicky Vaughnextras:
yoke gathers pull sleeves streak of skinny belting.
Muslin top kettle cloth skirt machine Green
or Peach. 5

New Spring Merchandise Arriving Daily.

"You Go Around Saying You're Terrific,
So Let Our Clothes Say It For You"

9 il m 9 0 9

S

OPEN

DAIL Y

9-- 6

SUNDAYS
2-- 6

District
resignation Glenda

w
shirtdress

wash-dr-

Can't

Kneblick, resource teacher,
and renewed the contracts
several for the 1976-7-7 school
year.

were adminis-
trators: John Paul Jones,
superintendent; Ray Saun-
ders, high school principal,
ErshelBird, elementaryschool
principal.

Elementary teaching per-

sonnel rehired and their cur-

rent assignmentswere' Kathy
Owen, kindergarten, Suella
Cox, headstart; Janet Black-we- ll

and Bettye Bird, first
grade; Joan Jones, second
grade; Alice Saunders,second
and third grades;Nell Byrum,
third grade; Margaret Gilbert,
fourth grade; Irene Colker,
fifth grade; Beverly Cole and
Eva Garcia; sixth grade; Kay
Dane, migrant; Clarice Ro-

bertson andJune Harris, read-

ing; Glen Parrish, SusanBen-

nett; resource.
In the junior-senio- r high

school, teachers
were: Kay Root, science;
Marilyn McLarty, math; Beth
Martin and Harla Brown, En-

glish; Janiece Robertson,
home economics; Murriel
Landers, business; Denny
Belew, vocational agriculture;
Clarence Law and Harland
White, history and coach;
James Shannon, math and
coach; Mike Bagley science
and coach; and Dan McCas-lan-d,

band.

Registration
0 slatedfor SPC
m Registration for the first

summer session at South

9
9

0

of

Plains College will begin at 9
a.m. June 1 in the SPC
Administration Building.

Persons enrolling in the
summer technical-vocational-occupation-al

programs
also will register at that time,
accordingto Jerry Barton,SPC
registrar and dean of admis-
sions.

Classesbegin June 2.
Bulletins for the 1976 sum-

mer term at SPC may be
obtained by contacting the
SPC registrar's office at

MR. AND MRS. R. V. ARMSTRONG

Mr., Mrs. R.V.Armstrong
to celebrateanniversary

Mr. and Mrs. R. V. Arm-

strongwill celebratetheir 50th
Wedding Anniversary with a
receptionfrom 2 to 4 Sundayin
the Willey Room here.

Hostessesfor the occasion
will betheir two daughtersand
their families, Mrs. Joe Foust
(Wanda) of Lorenzo, and Mrs.
John Mitchell (Sarah of Phoe-

nix, Ariz.
The former Louise Walden

and R. V. were married April
17, 1926 in Ropesville and
moved to Littlefield in 1928.
He is an electricianandowned
andoperatedhis own business
until his retirement in 1968.
The serving table will be laid
with a lace cloth over gold and
a gold candelabrum and a
three-tiere-d cake will accent
the table.

They have seven grand-
children and one

All friends andrelatives are

m

The Opening Of

LITTLEFIELD
GARDEN CENTER

THURSDAY AT 9 AM.

We are not fully stockedyet, but expectingtrucks asthey arrive. Leave your order for items wanted, if we don't
have them In stock we will get them.

We will handle hanging baskets, rose bushes, trees, flowers for both indoor and outdoor planting, tomatoes,
strawberries, potting soil, shrubs, etc.

Owners: RichardEddings,Arlen Simpson

South 385 At 84 Bypass - Just East Of Texaco Station

invited, and the couple
requests"no gifts please."

BOOKMOBILE SCHEDULE

The High Plains Bookmobile
will be in this areanext week.

Wednesday, April 21:
Whiteface 1. 9:30-10:3-

Whiteface 2. 10:30-10:4-

Lehman. 11:05-11:3- Bled
soe, 12-- ond Maple, 2:15-3:1-

Thursday. April 22: West
Camp, 9:15-10:1- 5; Lariat,
10:30-11:3- and Bovina,

Friday, April 23: Lums Cha-

pel, Spade. 0;

Hart Camp, 1:45-2:3- and
Fieldton, 2:45-3:3-

Saturday, April 24: Olton,
9:30-11-4- 5 and Amherst, 1:15-3:3- 0.

T helma Broivn,
Louise Rogers
to be awarded

Thelma Brown and Louise
Rogers from Littlefield are
among the 212 women nom-
inated for the Texas Pan-

handle Distinguished Service
Awards to be presented by
West Texas State University
April 24.

The recipients of the award
will be honored that day at a
Bicentennial Luncheon, which
will feature an address by
Sarah Weddington, attorney
and member of the Texas
House of Representatives.

The Texas PanhandleDis-

tinguishedService Awards are
being given for the first time
this year to highlight the role
women have played in the
development of the Pan-
handle.

Women from the top 32
counties of the Texas Pan-
handle have been nominated
for their distinguished busi-
ness, professionaland volun-
teer service

The luncheon will be from
11 a.m. to lp.m. in the WTSU
East Dining Hall. In addition
to Ms. Weddington's address
of 'Women; Past,Presentand
Future,' program plans in
clude a Media Festival, ex-

hibits by the Panhandle-Pla-ins

Historical Museum and
musicby the New Day Singers
of West TexasState

Tickets are$3.75 and should
bepurchasedby April 20, from
Dr Enid Bates, Chairman,
Women's Program Com-
mittee, Box 455, WT Station,
Canyon, Texas 79016 or tele-pho-

(806) 656-217- 2
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BEAUTY

THAT

UPLIFTS

unoundi ih. vmior to en
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loutct ot into fnon to tntbrtvd

HAMMONS

FUNERAL HOME

'Miss Lamb County'

Pageantis discussed
A Tau Chi Chaptermeeting

was held at the Heddy Room

Monday evening,April 5.

The meetingwas brought to

order bv the vice president,

Kyra Cox, when Tau Chi

memberselectednew officers

for next year.
They arepresident,Barbara

Starnes, vice president, Kris

Bean, second vice president,
Sharon Brown, recording
secretary,JaniceGraves;cor-

respondingsecretary,Freddie
Duke, treasurer, Kyra Cox;

city council, Sharon Brown,

and alternate, Pat Stubbs.
Tau Chi also discussedand

decided the theme colors and
decorations for the Miss Lamb

County Pageant
Members also discussed

that it would help Tau Chi if

girls who are interestedin the

"Miss Lamb County" pageant
would call either Mrs. Sam

Bean or Mrs Steve Cox.

Guests that evening were

Ja LeeSlate,Jerri Thomas and
Rhonda Minyard.

Hostessesfor the evening
were Freddie Duke and Bar-

bara Starnes. Title of the
program was, "A Woman

Chooses."
The meeting was dismissed

and everyone was served

Jeffrey Gamey
assignedto

combathospital
Army Private Jeffrey S.

Gamey. son of Brian R.

Gameyof Littlofield, was as-

signed March 23 to the 15th
Combat Support Hospital of
the 11th EngineerBattalion at
Ft. Belvoir. Va

Pvt Gamey entered the
Army in November 1975, com-

pleted basic training at Ft
Leonard Wood, Mo., and was
last stationed at Ft Sam
Houston, Tex

Phone 385-53- 46

Open
Mon. - Sal.
10a.m. - 9 p.m.

HAMS

IO

sandwichesand dessert.
Members attending were

Kyra Cox, Kris Bean, Dorothy
Powell, Sharon Brown, Bar-bar- n

Starnes, Janice Graves,
Pat Stubbs and Freddie Duke
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Now at a Weight Watchersmeeting
haveso much more in hrln ... ... l
goal weigni.
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Name

Address

City Zip li ' r
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Weight Watchersof West Texas, I
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CHARLIE'S
MEAT MARKET
WHERE & TRIM COMES FIRST

. tVIK

Shank End, Lb I ! till I

Meal & Freezer

ORDERS ON LYI

io Lbs

io Lbs

io Lbs imiiitN
PORK STEAK

io STEAK

iQLbsPORK ROAST
Lbs CATFISH STEAKS

Twelve-lOOzPk- gs SPINACH

C30c- -

Pkas Til D II IDC Anrnirft UK

Tweivo- -i o oz Pkgs

70 LBS MEAT & 60 PKGS

D II L U Super Value 1 12 Lb Loafs
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Vegetable Combination

ADVANCE

BEEF

Tvelve-lOO- z

A

,;.-- .

1200

Open

Sundays

lufxnirj ECU)

SQUASH
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WEIGHT WATCHERS

ROAST

GROUND

11 a.m. -- 7p.i

m
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Tweive-ioozPk- gs CHOPPED BROCCOLI
SLICED

CHOPS
CTClirp
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V

M

Cur, & Ready For FreezerFl
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Pioneer Days fpU

PETERMAN

lited in Lamb
enough to re--

Lal oil lighting?
rook stoves, ana

, old oil barrcll that
khe back yard with a

Pml' u
ou are nuv " u

ber, the paim ieui
board fans were the

mditionersthat were

ie never cleaned and
y oil lamp, trimmed
Led the wick and
flhe globe, you just
M know what I m

out
Iber the coal bin, and
eercarried a bucket

carried out the
(or

got something for

Jie next fire

hae never taken n

ash tub or usedan
Joilet, you are are not

toneer Well, get out
smoothing iron and
ird, put on a pot of
the back yard it's

early twenties, when
Bation of the existing
iegan to grow, most

lhad a light plant ot
and could provide

r for lights and small
.id the people began

to live a lot more modern
Then about 1942 or 1943,

West Texas Utility Company
came to Lamb County, estab-
lished their lines and through
a lot of cooperative effort,
served the towns of Lamb
County.

Then SouthwesternService
Company, a growing organi-
zation from New Mexico andat
Roswell bought out the exist-
ing facilities, put up a rather
largegeneratingplantat Tuco,
north of Lubbock near Aber-nath- y.

From this plant they
soon began serving Lamb
County.

Now about 1951, South-
western Public Service Com-
pany began expanding and
PlantX in Lamb County had its
beginning with a large gen-
erator shipped from the fac-

tory in Pennsylvania,coming
to Amherst on a special train.
It took severalcars to carry the
blocks, derricks, and other
equipment to move the gen-
erator from the depot to the
plant site, some 10 miles north
of town.

Plant X soon serviced, with
its many miles of high potency
lines, some 45,000 square
miles of territory, and soon
becamethe largestplant of its
kind in the world. Being
situated in the centerof Lamb
County, on a h line of
natural gas.

Some 18 sections of water

KIRBY
ICUUM CLEANERS

SALES & SERVICE

PAT'S
EC0RD CENTER

APPLIANCE DEPARTMENT

rights were purchnsed from
Halsell Land Company, right
on top of the Ogalnlla water
sands,where the company has
exclusive rights to all the
shallow water needed to cool
the generators that produce
enough electricity for many
miles around.

The plantcontinuesto grow,
and from a volts
in the original plant to a 450
thousandvolts capacity as of
1975.

Lamb County is indeed for-

tunate to have this enormous
facility to add to its economy,
andhistory will long record the
coming of Plant X and South-
westernPublic Service.

Insurancegroup

plans meet

Saturday
Membersof the local Chap-

ter 153 of Germania Farm
Mutual Aid Association are
invited to attend the annual
businessmeeting Saturdayat
2 p.m. in St. Martin's Luth-

eranChurch Annex.
All members are urged to

attend to vote on local and
state officers, and to discuss
items of policy concerningthe
insurancecompany.

Henry Arend is current pre-
sident, E. C. Hill is vice
president, A. E. Lichte is
secretary-treasure-r and Ernes-
tine Lichte is assistant secretary-tr-

easurer.

TAKE CARE
The driver in rush-hou-r

traffic must beconcernedwith
traffic safety, but he also
should be awareof the needto
practice good hearing conser-
vation while exposed to the
high noise levels that accom-
pany congestedcar and truck
traffic

ALL OF OUR FLOWERS
ARE LOCALLY GROWN

INCL UDING :

EASTER LILLIES
HYDRANGEAS

ARRANGEMENTS OF

CUT FLOWERS

SEND YOUR EASTER
LILLIES TO YOUR

CHURCH IN MEMOR

OF OR IN HONOR OF
LOVED ONE.

PLANTS ARE NOW READY!

620E.5TH

r

W 0pen Monda,"Sat' 9 AM 7 p - I
J0 v

U
Sunday 1 P.M.-- 6 P.M. I

A ( Reg. S4.27 58 Inch Diameter,")!

- A A ---
Jl fl& 1

I Nore,co 'mrT I

HB t39 n? 1

DON STUBBS was awardedthe "Lion
of the Year" plaque for the Early
Risers Lions Club Tuesday morning.
Presenting the award is Club Pres-

ident Larry Sanderson.Club members

Early Risers Lions
learn of camp projects

Three unique projects of
service, sponsored by the
Lions of Texas, were the pro-
gram subject of Milton E.
Laurie of Kress,director of the
Crippled Children's Camp at
Kerrville, when he spoke
Tuesdaymorning to the Early
RisersLions Club in the Com-

munity Center.
For 23 years, the Texas

Lions Camp for Crippled Chil-

dren at Kerrville has provided
two weeks of summer fun
free! for more than 16,000
handicappedyoungsters. The
Camp servesblind, deaf, mute

Ja 1
COMPLETE ASSORTMENT OF BEDDING

ni BHHvfSSfcLAHMHKHxJlSVB
BsBMkLP

vShBMBBPm

fHi2VVH
LLT-rfHiMBBB- I

P9PHL

CHISHOLM

FLORAL
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1
11

mm
385-44- 61 M$W

selectedDon for the honor becnuscof IUHMBIIHkSihI M
his devotion to the many causes of mtKHTwStSmmm m
Lionism. Stubbswas also electedthird K mBx H
vice president for the coming fflB53iMP-- - bSBSwflf 9
Photo by RobertPowers IBMmiII - jerfrfffiWjB S3

andcrippledchildren of Texas
betweenthe agesof 7 through
16 without charge to the
campers.

Since 1957, the Camp-wh- ich

hasgrown steadily to 17

permanentbuildings valuedat
morethan $700,000 hasbeen
used as the Texas Center for
the Blind and hashelpedmore
than 1,000 blind Texans.

And for the past five years,
the Lions have serveda total of
1,147 diabetic boys and girls,
ages 6 through 16, at the
Kerrville headquarters and
leased facilities at Friends-woo-d.

fLittlefield News

DEBBIE PURDYof Lubbock
visited over the weekendwith
her grandmother, Mrs. S. A.
Purdy.

MRS. KENNETH Griffen
and children, Kelly and Kyle

from Midland visited with her
mother, Mrs. S. A. Purdy
Monday.

MR. AND MRS. Aubrey
Randall from Dallas are visit-

ing Mae Randall and Mr. and
Mrs. Hershall Randall. They
will be hereseveraldays.

MRS. WINNIE RIDINGS,
grandmotherof Rev. Richards
Ridings, was dismissed from
the hospital April 12th. She
had major eye surgery.

N. N. FREY returned from
Possom Kingdom Lake Satur-
day. He reports a nice time
and not too many fish.

MR. AND MRS. C. W.
Parkmanentertainedrelatives
and friends with a pizza party
Saturdaynight. Thosepresent
wereMr. and Mrs, Coy Piercey
from Cordell, Okla., Mr. and
Mrs. De Verle Parkman and
son Gary from Lubbock, Mrs.
FreddieParkmanfrom Maple,
Carol Haile from Dallas, Sha-riss- a

Cowen and Regina Wil-

liams from Lubbock, Melissa
Shelton from Arlington, Chris
Wallace, Dennis Cowen and
Kevin Kirby of Littlefield.

Being A Single Adult

JesusOften Found

Himself Alone,

Do You?

Vou Don't Always

Have To Be Alone,

Surround Yourself With

Friends In The Single

Adult Department At

The First Baptist Church

Ljttlefield, Texas

,
fcvery.Sunday Morning

Fellowship 9Q
Bible Study Time 9:45
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Portraits
OneLow Price!

8x10 Color Portrait AT
PLUS A Portrait In

A Silver-Li- ke Metal Charm

per subject
per family

FAMILY GROUPS

ONLY $5.97

SUNDAY, APRIL 18

MONDAY, APRIL 19

Future JohnsonAcrylic

FLOOR FINISH
27 Fluid Oz. - -
Tougher Than Wax

Til I UL M
Si .83

COCA COLA
Throwaway Bottle

28 Oz
44

One
Two

100

Reg. $7.00

397t
Ladies Polyester

PANTS

55.77

True Value

LONG HANDLE
SHOVEL

Reg. $5.09

$4.07
Fashionable

STATIONARY
Box

Reg. 98r

267t

o o

Babies, Children
Teenagers,Adults

7
Plus 60 'Handling

AT

22 93a

Satisfaction
guaranteed

1 TO

10 TO

Dawn

DISHWASHING
DETERGENT

Bold

LAUNDRY
DETERGENT

Giant Size n off
SI I

Ladies

TANK TOPS &

SHORT SLEEVE

BLOUSES frt a
Reg. S3.99

For tot

Oz

.43

Z.Y
Super Strap PVC Vinyl

LAWN CHAIRS

$997

V J iCr '. 4? PT
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LARGE EGGS
APRICOTS
PEACHES
GRAPE JELLY
WHIPPING CREAM

BROWN & SERVE

ROLLS

1
CLOSED

EASTER

SUNDAY
STORE

Mon.
8- -8

Wed.

Closed

KUUnV

KKULLUL

GAYLORD
2 12

CAN

ELNA, SLICES

2 12
CAN..Ma

II fhpr's fir

I

ifFrr's

J)

.mmmmmmmmmmmBa

ircnpor:

CLUB

FRESH K TbF
eachmm.

Tues.

NO.

NO.

FARM PAC
US DA

INSPECTED, DOZEN,.

CRISCO
COCA COLAr
ICE CREAM
D M PUCOHonfs Spiced

4KBBBBBSiBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBB
NBBBBLBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBflBBBBBBBBBK?

A

tlfctll FarmPacPurePorkExt

X
Immfr-ZZSSS&- Si

FOOD CLUB

JAM OR RED PLUM

PRESERVES, 18 OZ JAR,

No. 2 12 Can..

SHORTENING
5 OFF
3 LB CAN

CUAPIT DAPIf Hunt's Pudding
4 Can Package.

P fl fl If I C C Keeb'er'Sugar or Fudge Drop
100 Count Bag, 20 Oz

SUPER

BODY

BUILDERS

$
EACH

LABEL

299
PLANT

FOOD

GREEN EARTH

$109

BORDEN'S

12 GALLON
ROUND CARTON..

STYR0

BAG

CAPRI

32 OZ

.MMmihitM

59t
.49
45c
59t
35(

590

690

STARFOAM

69t
BATH

98t

V

i

ORANGE JUICE

MINUTE MAID, FRESH

12 0ZCAN

CTD Top Frost' Fresh

J I

$

!129

OATS

FROZEN,

FOOD CLUB

18 Oz' 42 Oz

MISS CLAIROL

'CWKX Formula Packaae

SEA SKI

0z

$

59
TOPPINGfrL 4M

AUIDCDDICCRAIfDCKKICd Frozen, I

CDCADCToPFrost, h

1109

690 49$ 94c

SHREDDED

FOAM

BUBLE

RDnrrnn

HAIR COLOR

LOTION
&

4

THIS AD ARE

17, 1976

38

SUN-TA- N

61

5 Lb

Bog

OZ

OZ

Frozen,

PRICES EFFECTIVE
APRIL

KETCHUP

HUNT'S
BOTTLE

CRISP RICE

FOOD CLUB

PACKAGE

DOG CHOW
PURINA BEEF

hetbd 1OitXt
uvsmpooB

Mmci'a B

4

10 Oz Pkg.

mm' mw

14

Oz Pkg.

IN
THRU

13

& EGG

"

HAIR

SHAMPOO
CLAIROL

i08Flrr:$ 22
HAND LOTION

ROSE MILK

8 0Z

Milk f

10

I35

.1; .. mu,S .foM

mWIKhrim
ImmmmuBlMfwMfmm

39(

69o

$155 $289

m

Ltnij

IWE GIV0

rnxjv

rirauf
NECTAR

Libby, Pear or

Peaches,No. 211

mmmmWmWmWmmmmmmmw0 SBBB

TOOTHPASTE

GLEEM11

7 0z
$102

DATRIL
NON-ASPIR- IN

PAIN RELIEVER

100'S

'J?-!-,

39

39

29!

$42
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Get AcquaintedSpecials
I

; Meet: David Bell & His Service Staff

SHOCK SPECIAL

Front Shocks
Ubor
PlusTax

RearShocks
Ubor
PlusTax

CMOnl)

17.00
5.00

S22.00

BRAKE SPECIAL

Front Disc
Lnbor
PlusTax

17 00 RcnrDrum
5.00 Labor

522,00 PlusTax
GM Only

THESE ARE GENUINE

.

Q" -- ow wo ,e you a ucr on gas with twin

twin never usemore gasthan you For big use both

F0' and hall he A 0a ""onesave and bygas
the fuss.andMi Ita no to and

' lun And you take
'"0 U the and the

the and the oil your air you save too,

HEJ IT Twin
List price $23990

price
5- - saleslax 10 50

7(

no
payment $7 41 per

tor 36

Kill i. Hf no. nut
bjj,. . t JitW

15.00
14.00

BRAKE SPECIAL

Drum
Labor
Plus

15.90 Rear Drum
Labor

S21.90 Tax
GM Only

GM PARTS ONLY

A temptingoffer on a

15.90
6.00

15.90
6.00

S21.90

a

burners-
- Independenhrgr.iismak.ng lempttfig

lont'Med burners need meal,
smaller mea,s money unrig burner grill

bother
d,menS10n faintly meals ente.tam.ng eliminates

cooking
outside while keeps liavor beoause

h"ut houso burden conditioning, energy,

Buy one of thesegrills before
August andsave.

T

gasgnu.

1,1976,
Charmglow

Parly Host

NOW SAVE 3000
Discount $20990

Cash price $22040
Budget price' $266

Budget Terms down

month months

9J&

29.00

ntijgfc

7r - ""

Front

Tax

G.00

Plus

burners

NATURAL qascompany
tOwiWOOOl Mli'N.M.H"'""- - '

$21.90

m

ArklaGRB 40 Flavor Twin

list price $23820

NOW SAVE 3000

Discount price $20820

5". salestax 1041

Cashpnco $21861
Budget price $264 60

Budget terms no down

payment. $7.35 per

month lor 36 months.

Littlefield Major LeagueAll-Sta-

blitzed four opponentsin
the regional tournament at
Dimmitt last week fo earn a
berth in the West Texas
Playoffs at Levelland.

The Wildcats opened the
tourney by clubbing Bovina
44-1- 7. The local youths were
neverthreatened.

Mike Williams paced the
'Cats scoring by dropping in
10 points. Jerry Jones
bucketed seven and James
Randel six, Ronnie Smith and
Leslie Yarbrough both hit for
five and George Brockington
four.

Clark Pyaltn sank three
while Erick Sawyer and Jim
Burks tallied two each. Greg
Harris addeda free throw.

Littlefield stormed from be-

hind to down Hart 40-3- The
Wildcats trailed 15-1- 2 at half
but a 17 point outburst in the
third stanza gave them the
lead, for keeps.

Williams again topped the
'Cats scoringby hitting for 14

r
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The Lamb

been
the

for the
the

May

TAX

Dunn
Nllah

David

John

Ruth

154th
W.

Jack

paidby

grade girls
take second

girls took in
in won

the with 148
while the 118,
Olton and tied for third

90 each while
was last with 55.

won the 880 yard
n time

the unit were

JanaJonesand
The same four

girls the 440 yard
and a
time 56.1.

Major League

0EKTEHNUf.

Eighth
points

was close
with 11. sank six

and and Burks
four each.Smith two

and one.
36 point in the

half
from a 52-3- 1

over
21-1- 5 half, the

for 16 in the
third and 21 in the

take the win.
and Burks

all
had 13, 12 and

Burks 10. sanksix and

two
and Jonesone.

then
41-2- 7 the

tilt. This time
the was in

the entire game.
Burks with

and Jones
10. while

andSmith
in four each. and

two each.

tia
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XI NU NU CHAPTER Phi for a
Bicentennial (dip and doll, In red, with a red

and red, andblue 50 cents
eachor three for SI. The Bicentennialdoll be away
during and the

SHOP

LITTLEFIELD

Political
Announcements

County
Leader-News- , Littlefield,
Texas, has autho-

rized to announce
following persons as
candidates offices
listed, subject to ac-

tion of Democraticvoters
in the primary.

LAMB COUNTY
ASSESSOR-COLLECTO- R

Herbert
Rodgers

COMMISSIONER
PRECINCT 3

JackPeel
Thompson

PrestonPointer

SHERIFF
E. D. McNeese

L. Despres

COUNTY JUDGE

ForblsKirby

DISTRICT ATTORNEY
JUDICIAL DISTRICT

Doyle

JUSTICE OF PEACE
PRECINCT 4

E. L. Yarbrough

Political Advertising

Individual candidates.

"

score
118 to

Littlefield's eighth grade
second district

Friday Friona. Dimmitt
championship

Wildcats scored
Friona

with points
Morton

Littlefield
relay with of 1:58.2.
Members of
Darlene Williams, Bridgette
Twitty, Gloria
Brockington.

ran on
finished second with
of

points. Sawyer be-

hind Pylant
Randel tossed

in added
Yarbrough

A hugh output
second carried Littlefield

behind to deci-
sion Dimmitt. Trailing

at 'Cats ex-
ploded points

points
fourth period to

Williams, Pyland
reached double figures.

William Pylant
Sawyer

Yarbrough five. Brockington
contributed three, Harris

Littlefield slapped
Dimmitt again in
championship
however Maroon
control

pacedLittlefield
11 points bucketed

Williams sank
Brockington slipped

Sawyer
Randel managed

EwikB

Chanter Jmjj

'S,

of Beta Sigma Is selling tickets
drape dressed

bonnet white, accessories.Ticketsare
is to given

Festivities Dajs, is on display in window at
Ware's.

Glenn Batson

Elliott
Young

relay

eight

Blickwill Prlct

F7814 $30.95

F78 14 $33J5
G7814 $35 82

G78-1-5 $3S49

H7815 $3925

J7815 1 $39.95

Plg,$7St0303f ET
dependm! on tut
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Lisha Short, Sandra Healy,
Geanice Ward and Tisha Mar-

tinez combined for a 5:12.7
clocking in the mile relay to
take fourth place.

Mary Ann McGee andLeslie
Perkins earned fourth and
sixth, respectively,in the shot
put. Lavonna Sandersongar-
neredsecond in the high jump
while Geanice Ward took
sixth. Miss Ward also earned
second in the 80 yard low
hurdles and third in the triple
jump.

Bridgette Twitty took home
medals in three individual
events.MissTwitty won the 60
yard dash, took third in the
long jump and fourth in the
triple jump.

Gloria Brockington was se-

cond in both the220 yard dash
and thetriple jump and man-

agedsixth in the long jump.
Darlene Williams placed

fifth in the 100 while Jana
Jones was fifth in the 220.

l II. (State) M

ConiwIlcUttd Report or Condition of

of Littlefield

biifllnti Morch31,

blackwall

niiiny
cord bells
bust seller
available

regular

Lisha Short was sixth in
the yard dash and the
yard hurdles

Jamie Lee and Kfm Tollett
finished fifth and sixth,

in the 880 yard
dash.

district meet concluded
the girls track season

B

in
Bridgette Twitty scored

points to pacethe eighth girls
this seasonin track.

Gloria scored
and DarleneWilliams

Jones for while
LaVonna Sanderson
Geanice Ward tallied each.

Others scoring were Mary
Ann McGee eight, Lisha Short
four, SandraHealy two, Tisha
Martinez two, Jamie Lee two,
Kim Tollett one and Leslie
Perkinsone.

PUBLISHER'S COPY

Stwtlt StqiB Bonk

In the Stite of

-- ,19 76

SHEET ASSETS
Cash and dua from banht .
U S Treasury aacuritiat
Obligation of othtf U S Oovmmtnt agtnciat and corporation!
Obligations of Statt and politcal tubdiviiiortt
Othtr bondt notti, and dtbtrtturas

Sch

c
B

B

B

B

Corporate ttrxli
Trad nj account weuntet rf

Ftdtral fundi told and neurit purchattd undtr agreafnanu to ftwH D

a loan Total (ticlud ng unearned Income) A

b Lett Reierve for poti ble loan lotto
c. Loans Net

lease financing
Bank premises furniture and f rturet and other assets repretent ng bank premises
Real estate owned other than bank premises
Investments in unconsolidated subsid anes and associated companes
Customers habit ty to this bank on acceptancesoutttand ng

Other assets q
TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru IS)

LIABILITIES Jch .
Demand deposts oftndviduais and corporations T

Time and savingsdeposts of ind viduelt partnerships and corporations f
Depot ts of United States Government f
Deposits of States and poMical subd visions F

Deposits of foregn governments and offcul institutions f
Deposits of commercial banks f
Certifed and off cars checks f
TOTAL DCPOSITS (sum of items 17 thru 23)
a Total demand deposts f
b Total time and savings deposts f
Federal fundspurchasedand secunt es sold under agreementsto repurchase t
Other liabilities for borrowed money
Mortgage indebtedness
Acceptanceseiecuted by or for account of this bank and
Other lieblltes H

TOTAL LIABILITIES (eiciud ng subordinated notes and debentures) &.
Subord nated notes and debentures . jmA

Preferred stock
Common stock

No. shares outstanding
No shares authorised

b No shares outttand ng

78

50 33
ran 28

23

Drt

Surplus
Undivided profits
Reservefor contingencies and other capital reserves
TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 36)

ANO EQUITY CAPITAL torn of items 30, 31, and 3.7)

Average

securities

deposits

securities
borrowed

Koagerj, lonrroiier
i eOTTMf, l t f .

On

our low

both
60 80

Jana

BAUNCE

partnerships

outstanding

EQUITY CAPITAL

None"

TOTAL LIABILITIES

Texas

TexoJ

MEMORANDA

re m

-- G.s

Jfittr
Mmmiifw

whitewall

bins-pl- y

body
Road tread

prices

As
sleel cord

low

k AL

BED t
I 51.29 )

StaU Bank 1768

and SutmldUriw the of

Hani Col Mif Thou

7 3J884 ,
J I 37383 2
2 t U989 ,
3 t l TH95 4
4 t 1.304 j

None 6
Ntne 7
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7 A L 1?4

.J
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NKn

.." - . 25J7ay i

(Par.aiu.) None

(Par vaiii.) pOO
'firm

2.1302

for or days endingwith call date
a Cash and due frombanks (corresponds to item t above)
b Federal funds sold and purchased under agreements to resell (corresponds toitem above)
c Total loans (corresponds to item above)
d Time of $100 000 or more (corresponds to Memoranda Hems plus bek)
t Total deposts (corresponds to item above)
f Federal funds purchased and sold underagreements to repurchase (correspondsto item above)
g Other liabilities for money (corresponds to item above)
Standby letters credit outstanding
Time deposits of 1100 000 or more
a Time cert ficates of oepost in denominations of$100 000 or more
b ffI Vff flfflWtf to '"p ?! f?Sf ..iidim N,

tr ..a tl hwMfi W Iff
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'CustomPower CushionPolyglas'
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trade

1070new cars
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Suu e

eet hak, nlrmnty '' repert eehe
Camel AtUtt

Steer fe mn4

m

yff. -

eerfiy At aet er
We eapirea un"

with

GoodyiMr's bfsl-si'llin- g tire
e Polyester
e gripping

At

with

e
e Fiberglass
e America's
WMITEWALLS

The

and

rttimM

$39AR78-1- 3

whitewall
trade

advertisedon TV
e belts

Suro-foole-d handling

Othersues priced too

l A

PILLOW

Reg.

fsjIBSCflfS

No

Domwtle al cUmt

fgeeeflgeal

ij
13

j4
ii

prases
Np" 21

iiifll7-WW- W ;

lnn

faf& 30

34

ZZJJg35

IS 30 calendar

3a 3b

26
of

my

Cmtff LQI7W

AP111

n'(joSuoTflCarnuAjMry

TowerStreak'78

A78-1- 3

trade

cord

Goodyear Everyday Regular
'CustomPolysteeFRadial

95
with

Two

Low

JDR78 14

HR78-1-

JR7815
LR78
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MasterCharge BankAmericard

AmericanExpressMoney Card
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Thecat

American Cyanamid Company
Princeton,New Jersey08540

Before using stop
and read the label.

1976, American

' . A ( & -

.&i i .

V

it- -

f

P

stops
thetoughones.
Crabgrass.Fall panicum.Johnsongrass(from
seed).Barnyardgrass.Signalgrass.Purslane.
Pigweed(carelessweed).Lambsquarters.
Annual spurges.Thecat keeps
themall out of your cotton.Every
year.Whetherit's wet
the cat is easyan.you
crop, too. With
no carryover.
Get the cat.
In everycan of
PROWL herbicide

CYANAMID

PROWLx

Copyright Cyanamid Company
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wilh who! w. tall, but now
lhal hav your
afltnflon majr w.
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A Coltosiiid Yoi Can Dip tad Or,

MACHA
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Owkif Maturing
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MACHA

SEED FARMS
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Eve to EasterSeals...
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for crippled children and adults
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Girls9 Little
action now

Girls' Littlo Dribblers is
with teamscompet-

ing in minor, majorand senior
leagues.

SENIOR LEAGUE
Monday nction in the

seniordivision was a defensive
duel with tho Goodyear Blimps
edging out the
Comic Strippers, 13-1-

The score was knotted 4-- 4 at
and still tied at

the end of the third quarter
with an 8-- 8 score.The Blimps
went aheadin tho final stanza
to take the win.

Scoring for the winnerswere
Gloria Brocklngton with five,
Robin Messer and Elaine
Turner musteredin four each.

Kim Pace paced the Strip-
perswith six points.JamieLee
got three. Pam Fisher, Kim
Tollett and Angela Williams
sank free shots.

In other senior division ac-

tion that took place week
S and M Coin's Blue Angels
out fashionedWare's Fashion-etts-,

30-1-

The balancedattack by the
winners gave them an early

CHURCH
OF

LITTLEFIELD
715 PhelpsAve.

ANNOUNCES A TIME CHANGE
FOR THE SERVICES.

THE NEW TIME WILL BE

BIBLE STUDY 9:30 A.M.

10RNING WORSHIP 10.30 A.M.
lExtend o Warm Invitation To All, To Come Worship God With Us.
eve In a God Who Is Still Working In The Hearts And Lives Of His

"Jesus Christ The Same Yesterday,And Today, And
Forever." Hebrews 13:8

PastorClaude Woods

"Coker's cottonhasalways
madememoremoneythan
anyotherkind'

'.xmimmMwmii

7.fiT7KrWtF' 2JX.UVmmpmsv&rmm&fjvnsti'm.7!ikrr
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Vj..

JtAii
tA ,t.rr
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Made525lbs. lint, dryland
"I've been planting Coker's cotton for several years.
It mademe more money than any other
kind of cotton on my farms. I particularly like the
way it comesup and grows off. It comes up a lot
faster than most cottonsI've planted.
My Coker 5110 planted 2 in 2 out, dryland, made
525 of lint per acre last year. I'll have about
600 acresof Coker this year."

-I- V. P. DAVIS, Acuff, Tex. (Lubbock County)

Coker 51 10 was bred on the High Plains for Plains
conditions. It hasthecharacteristicsyou need!

Droiirtk ti
h"ln,..--i

Tolerant!

Wedum Early!

mke
fUH

4H

LongH-1116- " to

Strong!

3.5 to

Turnout:36 to 39

See your for Certified Coker 5110
Planting seed,or Roy at our
Lubbockoffice.

vB

p.s.l.

contact Forkner

A Protected Variety

COKER'SPEDIGREED SEEDCO.
Route 1 P.O. Box 49 Phone(806) 762-083-2

LUBBOCK, TEXAS

Roy Forknor, Associate Grower

underway

night's

Leader-New- s'

Intermission

fers

hasalways

pounds

78,000-- 85,000

"Mike":

glnnr

We

i.

HRPJM

4.4

j

S1

HMF.SW t--

Dribbler
underw

first-quart- lead and a drive
for the victory.

Scoring for the winnerswere
Bridgett Twitty with a dozen
points. La Vonna Sanderson
andGeanlceWard swishedtho
nets for a half a dozen points
each followed by Barbara
Jameswith four. Sandraf lealy
andJeanetteJohnsoneachgot
one.

Tuesday at 8 p.m. S&M
Coin's Blue Angels will take
on the Goodyear Blimps for
more Senior Division action.

MAJOR LEAGUE
Major League action Mon-

day night was a crowd thriller
with the Dairy Queen Dudes
railing in the final quarter to
squeek past the Littlefield
ButanePhillies, 24-1- 5.

The score was 9-- 8 in favor of
the Phillies at half time. The
leaderswere then sandwiched
by the D. Q. Dudesin the final
stanzain a rally.

Taking high scoring honors
for the winners was Lynn
Jaquesswith 15 points. Donna
Bryant got four, Kerri Day and
Joyce Patterson scored two
points each and Holly Stubbs
scored one.

Shayla Bridwell scoredall 15

points for the Phillies.
Friday night's major league

action was 29-1- 8 win by tho
Lamb Bowl Ten-Pin- s over
Sedell'sBarberettes.

The Ten-Pin- s took a first-quart- er

advantageand kept it
throughout the game.

Charla Pace was top scorer
for the winneswith 12 points.
Russell Giles swishedthe nets
for 11 and ReneaAltman got
six.

Venesha Schroeder was
high scorer for the eveningby
dumping in 15 points to lead
the losers in scoring. Kim
Terry got two and Tonya Mills
hit a free shot.

In other major leagueaction
Friday night the D. Q. Dudes
grilled the Lamb County
Chargers, 19-1- 2.

Lynn Jaquess took high
point honorsby dumping in 13

points for the winners. Holly
Stubbs, Donna Bryant and
Krista Brantley each got a
pair.

Scorers for the losers were
Felicia Hodgewith six, Pamela
Williams got four and Betty
Rosemond got two.

In the seasonopener for the
Major LeagueLittle Dribblers,
Powell's Trimmers clipped
Littlefield Butane Phillies, 21-1- 4.

Lynette Spencer bucketed
15 points for the winners.

Seventh grade
takes6thplace

The seventhgradeboys took
sixth place last week in the
Springlake-Eart- h meet.

Alvin Contreraswas second
in both the shot and the
discus.He also managedfifth
in the 100 and sixthin the 220.

Steve Vargas finished fifth
in the discus and sixth in the
100. Gilbert Muniz garneredin

third in the 880 while Dale
Demel placed fourth in the
high jump. Joo Paul McCan-nic- k

captured third in the 60

yard hurdles.
The mile relay team of

Contreras,Vargas,Demel and
McCannick was fourth.

The seventh grade is idle

until the district meet in
Friona which is set for April

22.

Girls Track
Wildcat regional qualifiers

are entered in the Dawson
meet Friday. The regional
meet is set for April 23-2- 4 in
Odessa.

ay
Christ! Wright hit four and
Viki Tunnell scored two.

SharlaBridwell got 10 from
the floor and a pair from the
free throw line to lead the
Phillies. Jill Yarbrough scored
two points.

MINOR LEAGUE
In Minor League action

Monday night, Littlefield Ser-
vice Center TV Bugs took an
8-- 5 win over the Armes Little
Deeres after a 3-- 0 half-tim-e

deficit.
DeAnna Sandersonswished

the nets for six points to lead
the winners. Cheryle Kemp
scored two points.

Elaine Chisholm and
Franklin shared scor-

ing honors for the Little
Deeres with two each and
Marnique Pace sank a free
shot.

Friday, Jones' Little Lambs
out flocked the Richard Real
Estaters, 16-1- 3.

The Little Lambs had eight
points in their pin at halftime
to the Real Estater's three.

High scorers for the event
was Betty Ann Dancer who
sank10 points for the winners.
Deonna Jones got four and
Gayla Cowan two.

Rachel Gonzales scored
eight for the losers, Paulette
Williams three and Sheree
Scott got two.

The debut of the Minor
League Girls' Little Dribblers
was a battle between Armes
Little Deeres against David
Bell Olds' Cadillac, Pontiac
andGMC's Bell Ringers,with
the Little Deerestaking a 22-- 9

win over the Bell Ringers.
In a balancescoring attack

TeresaBurnett and LaRhonda
Franklin each scored10 points
for the winners. Natalie Nel-

son got in a pair.
Kellie Stanleypacedthe bell

Ringers in their scoring with
three points. Carolina Cana,
DeannaFaver and Lynn Wil-

liams eachscored two.
Tuesdaynight's Girls' Little

Dribbler results will be in the
next edition of the

f JKjrjS

$. . .

g
Mm

F
620 W. 5TH

385-44- 61

JSElBESF St

II Armes

t pichcmr I Chevrolet
CONDITIONING J 1

TUBING I 610E.4TH
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Two individuals, one relay
earn regional berths

Two individuals and one
relay team earned berths in
girls regional track with fine
showings in the district meet
in Friona Friday.

The 440 yard relay team of
Pennie Sexton, Melissa Saw-

yer, Lori Westmoreland and
DeEnnaBlakely ran a 52.6 to
win the event.

Carol Sexton set a new
district recordin the high jump
with a leap of 5-- 0 to win ther

4

Mkt.

&

301 XIT DR.

A"

303 XIT

411 HALL

Karen Carter also qualified
by takingsecondin the discus.

The 880 relay team of
DeEnnaBlakely, Kelli Hamp-

ton, Gena Westmorelandand
Carol Sexton placed third. The
mile relay team of Carol
Sexton, Pennie Sexton, Lori

and Melissa
Sawyeralso finished third.

PennieSexton was third in
the 220 and Cindy Ristvedt

NEW

i

'

Call: 385-368- 3 Days Nights

APRIL

I

1

event.

&

AT

28-- 1 AT

&

AIR

E.

Xv

236 W.

fifth in the 440 and
sixth in the 80 yard

Lori was
in the and

fifth in the Kelli
Hampton took fifth in the

won the meet with
138'i and was
by
was third with 88W,

with 85 and last
with 78 'j

SUNSET SLOPE

MOBILE PARK

STREETS, LIGHTS,

INDIVIDUAL WALKS, STORAGE

TV, CELLAR, LAUNDRY.

AND

GROCERY

STORAGE HOUSES, WATER, AND GARBAGE

INCLUDED

IN MONTHLY RENT

Come By And Take A Look

100 NORTH SUNSET
FHA

Month Oj April

Wildcat Spring Sports Schedule

APRIL TRACK

TRACK (BOYS) FRIONA

TENNIS (GIRLS) AT ODESSA

-- REGIONAL GOLF TOURNAMENT ANDREWS

The Wildcat Spring Sports Sponsored

imsnoim
Floral

lutj

By These Merchants:

First Federal

Savings

Loan

385-51- 97

Keithley

Co.
DRIVE

385-4- 91

Monroe's Food

Uy
AVE.

385-33- 44

Westmoreland,

MODERN

HOME

FREE
Anchors Down-T-he

Schedule

'Campbell's

Plumbing
HEATING

CONDITIONING
1022 9TH

385-50- 20

Lamb County

Locker1

1101 E.9TH
385-55- 06

ran
Case Power

t Equipment

2ND
385-44- 27

placed
hurdles.

Westmoreland
fourth broad jump

triple jump.

broadjump.
Friona

points followed
Olton's 118'j, Littlefield

Dimmitt
fourth Morton

OFFERS

PAVED STREET

AREA,

CABLE STORM

STORE.

385-398- 3

BOYS MEET

MEET

Aprroved

Tie

APRIL TRACK AND MEET

APRIL

Is

Or"w'v

1028 E. 9TH

385-51- 26

205 W. 3RD

385-48- 48

"

J

Shook

Co. IJ

Pioneer Super

Market

Pratt's
Jewelry

5TH AND XIT DRIVE

385-51- 25
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THE SKAT
OFFICIAL LHS NEWSPAPER

SC SponsorsTournament
By TODD STAFFORD

The finals in the Student
Council Ping Pong-Volleyb-

Tournament were as follows:
in the ping pong competition;
Richard Rogerswon the boys'
singles and Paula Mears cap-
tured the girls' singles title.
The team of Kyle Jones and
Richard Rogersdefeated Rick
Hoppingand Dead Walden for
the boys' doubles. The girls'
doubles winners were Anita
Bryant and Tonya Tunnell
after capturing a final victory
over Dana "Ping" Bassettand
Stacy "Pong" Cline

The winners in the volley-
ball competition were- - The
Dirty Half-Doze- n consistingof
Rick Hopping, Dean Walden,
Larry McDonald, Bill Turner,
Randy Hall, and David Jones
in the boys' division and the
Undecidedsconsisting of Kim
Daniel. RhondaHollingshead,
Pat Morono, CarmaletaPatter-
son, Monica Phillips. Paula
Mears. and Sharon White in
the girls' division

A total ofS61 was turned in
from ticket sales, entry fees,
and the concession stand
sls This money will go into
the Student Council fund.

Vacatio n

Comes
LHS students are

out of school from April 15-1- 9

for spring vacation, and class-

es will resumeTuesday.April
20. Easter vacation is the last
holiday that studentswill have
until school is out May 28.

Six weeks of school remain
and will be filled with many
various activities. Regional
track and UIL competitionwill
be held April 24, Student
Council delebates will attend
the State Convention April
29-M- 1. and thechoir will go
to Six Flags on April 29. The
Jr.-S- r. Banquet will be held
April 24 and the
Banquetwill be held on May
27. Electionsof StudentCoun-

cil members, class favorits,
etc. will be heldduring the last
week of school Baccalaureate
will take place May 27 with
Commencement exercises
scheduledfor Friday. May 28

On March 26 the girls ran
track at Greenwood and
brought back 48 points for 5th
piece.

The 440 relay placed 5th
with a which added four
points to the team total. The
SSO relay, which consistedof
Carol Sexton. Gona West-

moreland, Pennie Sexton and
Melissa Sawyer, placed 5th
wttii a 1:54 7 for four points.
The mile relayers, Lori West-
moreland, Carol Soxton, Me-Hw- e

Sawyer and Pennie Sox-

ton. ran a 4 18 1 for a first
place fr 30 points.

in the 440 dash Cindy
Rietvedt ran a 67.8 for a 4th
place bringing four points to
the lata!points.

Karen Carter threw the
discus 97'4V for 2nd place
which addedeight points.

Melissa Sawyer jumped
4'8" for 2nd place in the high
jump for six points. Pennie
Sexton jumped 48" for 5th
piece far 2 points.

The Springlake-Eart-h meet
was April 2. The Catsaccumu-
lated 77 points for a 2nd place
trophy.

In the high jump. Carol
Sexton jumped 4'10" which
tied for 1st place. Pennie
Sexton jumped 4 '8" for 4th
place.

Karen Carter threw the
discus93'0" for 2nd.

Lori Westmorelandjumped
313" for 3rd placein the triple
jump. Carol Soxton jumped
30'4" for 6th place

Cindy Ristvedt ran the 80
yard hurdles in a 12.4 for 2nd
place.DebbieBurks ran a12.0
for 4th place.

Lori Westmoreland placed
fifth in the broad jump with a
15 2" jump

In the 220 yard dash Pennie
Sexton ran a 30 7 for 6th place.

I

THE WINNERS or the boys' Volleyball Tournamentwere the
group, the Dirty Half Dozen, which consistsof bottom row Rick
Hopping, Randy Hall, Dean Walden, (secondrow, Bill Turner,
Larry McDonald and David Joneson the top of the pyramid.

JR A
Ills m A:

ft
TONYA TUNNELL Anita Bryant are pictured here showing

their ping pongability as they won the girls' ping pong doublesat
the Student Council Ping Pong Tournaments.

TeamsCompete At Different Meets
The 440 relay team ran a

i 0 for 5th place. The 880
relay team placed 2nd with a
1:55.7. Cindy Ristvedt, Lori
Westmoreland,PennieSexton
and Carol Sextonran a 4:24.7
for 2nd place in the mile relay.

The girls track team will
travel to Friona for the District
Meet on April 9.

The varsity tracksters fin-

ished with 61 points and third
place in the Springlake-Eart-h

track meet.
Rick Hopping set two new

meet records. He threw the
discus 170-- 2 4, bettering the
old meetrecordby 20-- 2 ' i feet
He also bettered the shotput
record with a toss of 51-1- 0' 4

The old record was 51-- 1

Bill Turner took the 440 yard
dash with a time of 54 0, and
his time of 10.3 in the 100yard
dash was good enough for
second. Turner also placed
fourth in the discuswith a toss
of 136-10- '! . He placedsixth in
the 220 with a time of 24 4

Raymond Baiza took first in
the 330 yard hurdles with a

time of 42 7

Toney Cowan captured se-

cond spot in the mile with a
time of 4:58.8.

The Littlefield freshman
tracksters have been showing
great progress at the recent
track meets considering that
everyteamoutnumberedthem
greatly. With only nine mem-

bers on the team, they have
placed second atthe Wildcat
Relays with 71 points, tenth at
Hereford with 11, fifth at
Floydada with 58, and sixth at
Plainview with 10 points

They will travel with the
varsity track team to Denver
City. Saturday, April 10. and
will compete in the Varsity
division. Team members are
Ben Davidson, Eddie Elms,

Donnie Green, Larry Heller,
Danny Hinckley, Wayne Lu-cu- s,

Jeff Lust, Keith McCain
and Richard Soria.

When askedto commenton
his team, Coach Buddy Comer
said, "They're a young team,
but they do have a lot of spirit
and pride to compete against
teams that outnumber them.
They still havea lot to learn "

Flashback

The girls volleyball team
were champs in
1975

H I, " ''bbbbb "T iHbkr abbbv .JbIbbbbHBbbW'I
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THE GROUP the Undecided which consisted of Monica Phillips, Rhonda Hollingshead, Paula

Mears, CarmaletaPatterson,Sharon White and Pat Moreno won the girls' Voile) ball Tournament.
PaulaMears also won the girl's singlesin ping pong.

Seniors
BILL TURNER, son of Mr

and Mrs. James Turner, has
been active in National Honor
Society, football, basketball,
and track. Bill has made

ct and All-Sou- th

Plains in football and has
qualified for Regionals in track
during high school in addition
to receiving numerous other
athletic awards. He plans to
attend college after gradua-
tion, and his favorite pastimes
are going to Lubbock and
watching television. The thing
that disturbs him most about
school is that it doesnot offer
any variety.

LONNIE TWITTY. son of
Mr. andMrs. Twitty, has been
in" football and basketball.He
madean team
in basketball three times this
year, and was named to the
All-Sou- Plains team in
basketball.

RICKY WALBRICK. son of
Mr. andMrs. Bobby Walbrick,
works at Jolly Roger's and
plans to attend college after
graduation.He hasbeenin DE
and his favorite pastimes are
watching television and mes-

sing around.
KIM WALLACE, daughter

of mr. and Mrs. Eddie Wal-

lace, has beenactive in band,
choir, FHA, FTA. National
Honor Society, and Learn and
Live. She has been FHA
President, Are I FHA Secre-

tary, Choir President,and has
won three sweater awards.
Kim works at Furr'sandplans
to attend Texas Tech after
graduation. Her favorite pas-

times are sewing, cooking,
going to Lubbock, andtalking.

CARRIE WARE, daughterof
Mr and Mrs. Kenneth Ware,
hasbeenactive in FTA, band,
cheerleading, and Student
Council. She has won an art
scholarshipherjunior yearand
was selected to Who's Who
Among American High School
Students.Sheworks at Ware's
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and plans to attend Texas
Tech The thing that bothers
her most about life is people
who are inconsiderate and
apathetic

JOHNNA DEAN WATERS,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
JohnWaters,was in FTA her
sophomore year and Business
Club herjunior year.Sheplans
to attendSouth Plains College
after graduation,and her fav-

orite pastimes are riding
aroundand having fun.

LORI WILKINSON,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Curtis Wilkinson, has been
active in band, cheerleading,
Student Council, and FTA.
Sheplansto attendTexas Tech
after graduation,and her fav-

orite pastimes are tennis,
swimming,reading,and being
with friends.

MIKE WILLIAMS, son of
Mrs. Jo Ann Williams, has
beenactive in National Honor
Society, DE, and band. Mike
works at Ware's and plans to
attend college after gradua-
tion. His favorite pastimesare
playing in the rock band
Spectre, water skiing, and
Partying.

r Skat Staff
The SKAT is edited by the

fifth period Journalism stu-

dents of LHS and published
every other Thursday by the
Leader-New- s without expense
to the school or taxpayers.

The SKAT invites other
mediato usestoriesor articles
therein.

Editor-Jerr- y Schulz.
Feature Writing-Dolore- s

Mendez, Christene Christan,
andTodd Stafford.

Reporters-Cynd- i Norried
and Julian Saenz.

Track-Debbi- e Spencer,
Doug Perrin, andStevo Cruz.

Advisor-Mr- s. Perkins.

SC Eecfions
Theelectionsfor the 1976-7-7

Student Council will be held
Monday April 26. The candi-
datesmust tum in their peti-lion- s

by Friday the 23 comp-let- e

with tho signaturesof 25
students.

Tho positions which are to
be lilled during the elections;rL.!s,,, ...Wl .,,.
mentarian, publicity director,
social chairman,andtwo

There is a
changein tho election of class
representatives. In the past
there were four representativ-
es from eachclass. This year
there will bo only one boy and
one girl representative from
each class.This will eliminate
eight representativesandonly
allow room for students who
wish to fill the job to its fullest
capaity.

The duties of the Student
440 RELAY consisting of Gena Westmoreland, Carol Sexton, Council membersare unlimit-Meliss- a

Sawyer, and Pennie Sexton placed first in district e They must secure assent-competiti-

at Friona on April 9. blies, repescnt the student

ii niTtYTF1'- -''

;.Soon
Thomas

Jefferson, 1743

April Break
April 21-- C. Assembly
April Track Meet
Aril James

Buchanan,1791

April Meet
(Odessa)

April 2G-- C. Elections and
Rally 9:30-10:3- 0

April Ulysses
S. Grant. 1822

April James
Monroe, 1758

April to Arling-

ton and S. C. to San Antonio

YiBBWB
Richard doubles

Mudent Ping and
uean Walden,

Competition
The LHS studentsplaced in

district UIL competition at
and will competo in

competition in
Odessa on April 24, Those
studentswho placed at district
were Jerry Schulz, second in
editorial writing; Anita Bry-an- t,

second in spelling and
plain writing; and Connie

To Be Held
at all school events,and

serveas a liaison betweenthe
student body and the adminl-stratio-n.

When how shothough
of last year's StudentCouncil
Mrs. Reast the council's

replied, "The Student
l;ntinfil l,o.l r

! .
iMjou ,nn nnot ,. ai
have accomplished many firsts

the school andhavebeena
fineStudnet Council."

Four StudentCouncil mem-ber- s
wereelectedto attendthe

State Convention at Waco.
These members are:
Lackey, Blake Wood, Carrie
Ware, and Lori Wilkinson.
They will hold a

session at the
convention and will also
receivethetrophy won by theStudent Council at Levelland
earlier in the school year for
OutstandingStudent Council.
They will leave April 29 andwill be gonethrough 1

Around LHS
V1CA held May 3.

Two Auto Mechanics stu--

dents.Gregory Boll and Doug- - ""SINLSS CLUB

I. vi,.ninnM ntionioH ihn Tuesday, Aoril R .1 1 v

1976 PlymouthTrouble businessclub members

ing Contestthat washeld April uss P,a for the S

6 at Lubbock High School. The ,.V e8S

two students were sponsored
by Garland Motor Company.
The Trouble
test consistsof each two-ma- n

team, representing a school,
being assignedto a new car in
which a seriesof malfunctions
havebeendeliberately placed.
All the malfunctions in the
cars are identical, and are
related to the electrical start-
ing ignition, and fuel systems
or body hardwaro of the car.
Teamsracethe clock and each
other to normal running order.

Students who quality
through the examinationspro-

ceeds to the state champion-

ship. The winners of the state
championship will win

paid trip to the Na- -'

tional Championship atChi-

cago, June28, 29, andthe 30th
where they compete for scho-

larshipsand other prizes.

Cheerleaders

The Varsity Wildcat cheer-
leaders had a garage sale
Saturday,April 10 from 9:00 til
6:00 at Lori Wilkinson's house.

FTA
FuturoTeachers of America

met Monday, April 5 to dis-

cuss electing teacher of the
year. The final selection will
bemadeat their meeting tobe

Black, first in headline writing
and first in newswriting. Jerry
and Connie competed in the
journalism contests on March
29, and Anita competedin the
literary events on April 3.

iTmarwi

!

JONESand Rogers won the in the
Council Pong Tournamentheld April 1 2. They

Regional

body

asked

spon-
sor

ihio

for

Steve

May

Shoot- -

Shooting

KYLE

4

r 1

hunt will take nW u.1
day at 11 am .April J
Hum win ue at the
bchool

Band
The 1976-197- 7 drum,

and twirlers fortheLHSB
will bechosenthe list i
April There will be in
town judge for both tr
and drum majoring Sefel
oi two drum majors ujl
least three twirlers il,
made

The 1975-7- 6 drum

were Lisa Garland (head)rl
Karla McCanlies lassiscl
The twirlers DtiJ

Burks, Cindy Drake

Karen Carter

Assembly
A Manachi bandfrcnS

Antonio Jr College 3
form music and dancitgbJ

assemblyon April 20

Six Weeks Test
April 13 and 14 mere i

signaledas six weeks twil
at high school These mil
last scheduled test beforti

final quarter testwhich C
given on May 27 and 2!

Home EcCb

Host Board

Monday night, April

ihehigh school bomerji

department the hom

girls entertained the Ij

schoolboard members i

dinner Guestsarmed it

p.m., and the dinner

completed at 8 30 p.m H

ing their dinner board

their meeting in the

school cafeteria
Rori'lncr the truests

Janice Lee Sharletu

andCindy Norried llelpq

tho kitchen were u
Chancy, Kim Wallace

Brenda Sterling Superw

were, homemaking test

Mrs Dorothy Keeling

Linda Harbin and Teal

.iiftnnt tpacher Miss Pl

Sanders, former LHS

uate
The dinner was prepa

!hn hnmemakinit COOl-

classes

Connie received two

medals, and Jerry nd J

nni--k rvmvH "dUeft

Winners at OdessanUl
vanco to the State JW

Austin in May

,?

-- v..u,vU .in iiujipinR ana

Three Win In UIL

Friona

,"doT.

r

were

the

...tCoBl'iru ti,.t,t. . . . ....."in "iNfMfcKS Jerry Schulz, Anita uryani, " ""." ,tfrl
Hioceu m uisirict competition in Journalismanu ."

4$
. Of lALk L.LJI



CLASSIFIED
ticimg arc 10

..r ward 1st in

($1.50 minimum
j and 6 cents per
nd insertion ($1.00,

ri charge). Blind

,1$ are $1.00 ad-la- l.

IFIED RATES:
:r column inch first1
n

Ions,

and additional
$1.15 per.

inch.

SPLA"Y

If Thanks 1 time
mum of 20 words,
ill cards of Thanks
g words are to be
id at regular
d rales.

ni;iETnro;l
G APPLICATIONS for
helpatCharliesMent

. Contact Charles Ary.

MAN for record keep--

Mefield Feeders, seo
Plowman, apply in

h APPLICATIONS for
) waitress at Cres. Club.

t Charles Ary TF-- A

tnEE NEEDED in
tsd Ranch store for
tad mounting tires,

m and general sales--

ipenence in tires nnd
ft'jipment needed Re--

it plan paid vacation,
e Apply in person,
505 Hall Ave , Little- -

TF-- G

L.V.N7S. GOOD
KING CONDI- -

IS, EXTRA GOOD
PHONE 3S5-39- lor

p;s

Director of Nursing
ew Nursing Home

W benefits, R N re-m- i,

experienced in
wsion of choree

staffing, and in- -
ice training Also

fed, LVN s for charge
duty, free life in- -
e openings for 3--

Letelland Nursing
210V Ae. Chris

I'P' administrator
PN-70I- 1 An equal

"lunityemplojer

Pl'Y sell, trade or rent
llruleres Phone 385- -

TF-- N

jflELDSelfStoroge, ',
o" Uttlefield onrH7 24 hour self

Jou keen key-niir-

economical personal
ai storaco. indi- -

rage-- 7 x 12 in in
seholdgood, merchan
ts, campers, tools.
M533 nr mmn !.
dDehntingCo TF-- S

Senlnr i.ilivAn mLi
imieflclH .,...

Call385-M2-
5

Fcion gratis para
uc oo anos or

Biml.
ainformacion, TF-- S

PU VenUS nitmnlU
N 'tabilued Aloo
tontact Mem Kelton,

My Mary Kay

: Freddie Duke
385-50-

64

14th

U1 toy poodle with
ar ansuov l

LAncJi. ri
kvT newara.
F593 or 3RK..1KRJ

2?Herman Shop.
i.

,. ;" """o
dog or "ho

W,l3e
4 TF--

"WX

APARTMENT for rent m
Littleficld, Call 21G-3G1- 5

4-- 1

I TTYrm&Wt

THREE BEDROOM, Cannon
Terrace, carpeted, built-in- s,

fenced in back yard. Call for
appointment. 385-571- TF-- F

HRICK HOME with 3 bed-room-s,

living room, dining
room, remodeledkitchen, Vh
baths, doublecar garage,cel-

lar, storm windows and doors,
1 ' lots. Seeowner at 201 E.
14th or call 385-526- 4-- 1

URICK, 3 bedrooms, 1',
baths. 2 corner lots, Fenced
backyard. Cellar, 24 x 26 den,
centralheating, built-in- s. 1101

E. 6th. 385-328-

THREE bedroom home. 90

(percent) loan available of

S15.40Oappraisedloan value.
Selling price$16,000. 1224 V

6th. Phone385-544- TF-- R

THREE bedroom, 1 bath, dou-

ble garage, cellar. Has small
well, 7 acresof land. Located
on Sunset and old 81 hiway.
Ideal for trailer park. Contact
385-355- 5 or 227-231- Sudan,

after 6 p.m TF-- D

For saleby owner.
Large three bedroom
home, choice corner lot,

doublegarage, large den,
large living room with

fireplace, 3 baths. 125 E.

25th Phone385-593-

Three new, 3 bedroom,2
bath homes under con-

struction One 3 bedroom,

2 bath home in Duggan.

Paul Carmickle Real
Estate, 385-513- 1

JVETTTEni

WANTED: Clean furniture,
appliancesand antiques.Will

buy one piece or houseful.
385-371- 4 or 385-597- 9

TF-- Y

rfBimcl rrIMtiJl-ll- 1

CONCRETE block service sta-

tion at Hula 933-231- 2

GRAIN FED calves for sale
246-364-

New 1976 Nomad 20 ft.

camper trailer with refri-

gerated air and T.V. an

gerated air and T.V. an-

tenna. 125 E. 25th. Phone
385-593-

CARPET SPECIALS

Commercials
& Tweeds $5.75 up

Kitchen Patterns$8.00 up

Regular
Hi Lows $5.95 up

ShortShags $7.00 up

Multicolor sculpture
Shags $7.50 up

Astro grass $6.50 up

All 100 nylon installed
on ' inch foam pad.
Samples& Freo Estimates

Call Jakeor Rill Duncan
106 E 14th St

385-495- 3 or 385-619- 4

PUMPS: 2-- 6 inch, 250 ft. and
280 ft.
and25 horsopower. All 180 ft.

385-362-
TF-- B

YOUR neighbors trade atj
StateLine Irrigation for all

their Irrigation needs.Why
not you? Llttlefleld
Levelland, Muleshoe.TF-S- j

MASSEY-ferguso- n 65 LP. Ex-

cellent condition. Call 246-364- 5.

TF--

FOR RENT office space,
900 sq. ft. Car-

peted, Downtown lo-

cation. Call 385-514- 7 or 385-686-

TF-- A

FARM for sale, 4 miles East of
Spade, 104 irrigated acres.
Contact TF-- C

190 ACRES dryland farm for
sale. 1 mile west of Hula.
385-575-

4.15.n

LOT FOR SALE. 18th St. 62.7
ft. front, 164 ft. deep. Marlin
Yarbrough at Merlin's Food.
385-475- TF-- Y

6 LOTS in 1 plot, on Smith
Street. Phone 385-468-

Lots 1 land 12 on W. 4th
St.

Lumber yard in thriving
town.

3 good frontagelots on E.
4th.

Mills Real Estate, 1106

Hall Ave. 385-345-

Country home on pave-
ment.Within four miles of
Littleficld. Five acreswith
3 bedrooms, 2 baths,den,
basement, central heat-
ing. Curtis Chisholm Real
Estate, 385-601- 7 or 385-510- 2,

--WINGO
REAL ESTATE -

385-46- 84

143 N VVESTSIDE AVENUE
LITTLEriELD TEXAS 79339

Over 't acre with 2 bed-

room house, own water
well. Fruit trees, fenced.
Just off of Loop yet in
City. All For $12,000.

3 bedroom, 1 bath, large
den,carport. 708 E. 15th.

$12,600.

622 East 8th. 2 bedroom,
1 bath, den, corner lot.
House needsrepair. Only

$8,000.

409 West 2nd. 3 bedroom,
1 bath. New carpet and
paneled. Plus small bed-

room and bath at rear of
house. Garage and long
carport. $11,500.

123 East 14th. 2 bedroom
andgarage,Stucco. Good

carpet Reduced price
$9,500.

125 East 15th. Nice corner
lot, 3 bedroom, 1 bath.
Carport and detachedgar-

ageand large store room.

$13,600.

Down town businessbldg.
for sale or consider
leasing.
List Your Property with
Us

Robert Richards Real Estate
109 E. 4th 385-329- 3

Gilbert Lemmons385-362-2

SandraRichards 385-571- 9

Robert Richards 385-571- 9

Equal Housing Opportunity

50 ACRES Irrigated, li mile

north of Amherst About ' in

bcrmuda. Good wells, fences

andsprinkle system.Call
3'TF

V 1 I Km MJ iu
1974 11U1CK Apollo, air condi-

tioned, heater,power steering,

almost new tires. Very good,

condition Call 385-343- 0 or
385-503-

T.F

1973 VEGA Station wagon GT.

28,000 miles, air., good car.

U30 W. 9th. 385-425- 9. TF-- H

1969 Chevrolet, IwKpickup.

GrcedwRitfJfilm) point.
396 enfiuWf

transmission,powersteering.

1950 WILLYS jeep pickup, 4

wheel drive with high low

range. Contact Raymond Du-va- il.

246-324- Amherst.4-18--p

WE RUY old cars, trucks,
tractors,scrapiron and metal.
Ray Franklin, 905 W. Delano.
Lamb Salvage,385-550-

WHEAT-- Mites, Cinch bugs,
green bugs arc killing your
wheat. Not just dry weather.
Don t lose irrigation invest-
ment.J. L. Cox Spraying,933-230- 0.

WILL BUILD concretecellars
and basements. H. G. Fer-
guson,385-550-

KEEP carpet cleaning pro-
blemssmall use Blue Lustre
wall to wall. Rent electric
shampooer $1. Nelson's
Hardware)

MATTRESS-OWNER- cotton
new springandcover.Guaran-
teed 10 to 20 years. Price
$44.50 to $69.50. Call Mrs.'
Steffey 385-338- 6, agent for
A&B Mattress,Lubbock. TF-- A

TREWAX rug shampooerfor
$2 per day. Harrell Building
Supply, Anton. TF-- H

JIMMIE GRAY roofing,
painting, general carpentry.
All work guaranteed. Call
385-506- TF--

SEWER stopped up? Let us
unclog your sewer line with
our Roto Rooter Service. Har-

rell Building Supply, Anton.
997-362- 1. TF-- H

RENT CONVALESCENT
equipment at Brittain Phar-

macy. Wheelchairs, crutches
hospital beds, other items.
Complete line convalescent'
needs.

JF--B

II SAW sharpening, skill, chair,
m and hand saws, work guaran

teed. James K. Wood, ua t.
16th, 385-434- TF--

YOHNER'S Feed and
Seed.Gardenseed, Ferti-lom- e

Fertilizer, hanging
baskets, concrete bird
baths, Dekalb Seeds,
fountains.409 W. Delano.

John'sNursery
Bedding plants, hanging
baskets, pot plants, tree
prunning. 385-566- 8th

and Westside.

MARTIN HOOFING

Roofing Specialists
Roofing of all kinds
Asphalts of all kinds

Asphalt Built-u- p Roofs
All Work Guaranteed

Uttlefield
1U5W.9U- -

7

' hjmi li'i Mi i ILHI

1969 GRAND PRIX, amfm.
power windows and seats.
Leather seats. $1,000. Call
385-604-

1964 CHEV. pickup. Can be
seenat 917 W. 7th.

1974 Ford Thunderbird,
$4,495.

1974 Ford Custom 500,
$2,895.

1974 Monto Carlo Chov.,
20,000 miles and nice,
$3,995.

1974 Ford RangerXLT i
ton pickup. LWB, $3,850

1970 Chev. Monte Carlo,

$895.

1970 Lincoln Contennen-tal-.
Low miles and nice,

$1,495.

1972 Monte Carlo Chov
Loaded and nice. $2,695

Carlisle-Oldha- m

Ford, Inc.
525 Phelps

385-516- 4

akjkli JKL
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Accoustical Spraying

Benny Goss

401 W. 4th
385-56- 36

Storm Shelters and All
Kinds of Concrete Work

Phone 385-614- 4

RosalesConcrete

CONKLIN MAINTENANCE
SUPPLIES

For the Farmer:
fuel Conditioners, Lub-

rication Supplies.
No order too small or too
large. Thank you for your
business.
RAY REED SALES &.

SERVICE 385-496- 4 &
385-512- 2

Uh
SAVINGS AND LOAN

"Conventional Loans

Home Impr. Loans

"Installment Loans

Littlefield Office
7thandXIT
Ph. 385-514- 9

Industrial

BEARING & BELTS

Forney Welders
& Supplies

Farm Equip.

G & C AUTO SUPPLY

700 E. 14th

385-44- 31

.3 Monuments-memoria- ls

. Granite-marb- le

J; Cemetery curbing g

E Grave covers-vas-es g.
0)

U
o 1407 Nichols

a
385-35- 39

Littlefield, Tex. g

Grass levels-uprig- hts

Authorized

Briggs-Stratto- n

Service Center

Small Engines

Welding Tune Ups

TERRY

MOTOR SERVICE

Mufflers-T- ail Pipes
Alternators Generators

GeneralRepair

JOHN TERRY

Phone 385-528- 7

910 Delano

Littlefield, Texas79339

R... .z. JfTHm"" r

THE GALLERY

306 PhelpsAve.
Littlefield

Offers
Custom Picture
Framing
Ready Made Pic-

ture Frames
Art Prints
Craft Materials
Always Good
Buys In Art Sup-

plies
Store Hours

9:30-5:3-0

Mon.-Sa- t.

Phone385-62G- 2

Our SeventhYear

o
VI

O
o

LITTLEFIELD NEWS

GENE MARTIN and family
from Stockton, Calif, visited
his uncle and aunt, Mr. and
Mrs. Harold Martin a couple
of days last week. Also Bill
Martin, another nephew,visi-

ted Monday. P. M. Bills'
father from Clovis was with
him.

MR. AND MRS. Gerald
Jaquessfrom Lubbock visited
his sister, Mrs. Lyle Brandon,
Sunday in the hospital where
shereturned Saturdaynight.

A Very Limited

Supply Of

MACHA

9173 and rB
MILO SEED

Order Today For

Your Supply Of
This Profit Making
VersatileSeed
Bred Especially
For This Area.
See Your Seed
DealerOr Call

MACHA SEED FARMS

Box 248 385-60- 94

Campbell'sPlumbingCo.
HeatingAir Conditioning

SheetMetal Work

(Sk
Complete stock of repair
parts for all major lines of
plumbing, heating, air
conditioning products.
Service on all major lines
heating and

equipment.
SalesService Installation.
Bus. Phone385-502- 0

1022 E. 9th

Miravel's
Tortilla Factory

Now open

603 W. Delano

Tortillas, Tamales,
Bar-b-q-ue

farmerstciul to Ik
pretty tough cuMomers They
want to get overylhinj; they
canout of every nickel thev
spend Ami that'sgood

Becausethe tougher
they get the more likely they
arotousoCifford-llilrsPV- C

loflnrrm
NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Notice is hereby given that
sealed bidswill be received
until 10:00 o'clock A M . April
30, 1976, by the Commis-

sioners' Court of Lamb Coun-

ty, Texas, at which time all
bids will be opened at the
Commissioners'Court room in
the Lamb CountyCourthousein
Littlefield, Texas, for the fol-

lowing insurancecontracts for
the year April 30, 1976-Apr- il

30, 1977:

Workmen's CompensationIn-

surance covering all county
officials and employees.
ComprehensiveGeneral Lia-

bility and Comprehensive
Automobile Liability In-

surance, and Uninsured
Motorists Insurance In-

surance.

The Commissioners' Court
reservesthe right to reject any
and all bids,

Further information may be
obtained in the County
Judge'soffice.

By order of the Lamb
County Commissioners" Court
this 12th day of April. 1976

sMary Beth Willey
Mary Beth Willey.

County Clerk and
Clerk of the Commissioners'
Court

Yv

!HB

8th preps for
district meet

The eighth gradeboys man-

aged seventh in the Spring-lake-Ear- th

track meet
The mile relay combo of

Greg Scott, Johnny Sierra.
Pablo Trevino and Lester
Wormly nabbedsixth.

Trevino took fourth in the
880 while Ricky Oglesby was
fourth in the 60 yard hurdles.
JoeYbarrafinished fifth in the
440.

Tommy Williams was se-

cond in the 330 yard hurdles
and fourth in the 100 yard
dash Rex Freeman was se-

cond the pole vault

Van Wick Electric)
Heavy Duty Slicing l

I
KNIFE 513.39

Xfj 7 11

Gibson's
il l'LJ-l'L- J J.li"T1f1.

M
you needto be

Woodmen!
We have an Orphan's

CareAssistanceprogram
that will care for children
of our membersorphaned
by the death of both
Woodmenparents.

Financial Assistanceis
availablefor infantsto age
18 and even a collegeex-

tra. Ask our representative
about the "Family Fra-
ternity" way.

Edgar McCanlies
112 E. 14th

Phone38W3M Littlefield. Texas

WOODMEN OF THE WORLD

LIFE INSURANCE SOCIETY
HOME OFFICE OMAHA NEBRASKA

"The FAMILY Fraternity"!

Ourfuturewith
Gif ford-Hil- ls PVCpipe

hasmadehistory.

When the groundstartsshilling you need a pipe that won't argue I ho
pipeshouldho flexible andthejoints should slip a little so the pipegoo
wherethe groundwantsto take it

You needa patentedrubbergasket joint that lots it slip without
leaking anda service program that will take careof you il something
goeswrong

I here'sonly oneway lo got all that Buy Ciifford-- I lill's PVC
Whether you need a pivotal system, anundergroundPVC hyMum, or

an aluminumsurlaco system, you ust can'toutdous
All you have lo do is to take a look at our past That shouldgive you a

very good ideaaboutwhat to expect in thefuture

Gifford-Hi- ll & Company,Inc.
P. O. Box 2748
Lubbock, Texas79408

1
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Girls seventhgrade trackteamtakesdistrict title
winner. Poni was first in the the long jump andthe 220yard

Llttlefiold seventh irrmln
girls easily won the district
championship Friday in
Friona. Tho Wildcats scoreda
whipping 160 points and were
followed by Olton's 117, Fri-ona-'s

86, Dimmitt's 74 and

Poni

second

afcaf r i A mm7vzV'HL3jmhHm1

MEMBERS OF THE seventhgrade district championgirls track team shown on the front row, from left to arc: Sharon
Walbrick, Ray Ann Sebring,JeaneTorres,Poni JeanetteJohnson,Arlene Willioms, Silvia Pam Fisher

AngelaArmes. the back are managerSherreePointer,managerDavida Thompson,Robin Street, Linda Glover, Alvina
Sarah Long. Diane Marcus. Cindy Klein. Sally Wilkinson, Melissa Lou ranee, Ruthie

Photo

Minor All-Star- s battle back for 2nd
The Littlefield Minor

Loague All-Sta- battled back
from a forfeit in the opening
game of the regional tourna-
ment in Dimmitt last week to
take the runner-u- p spot.

The first gamewas forfeited
because the 'Cats were not
ableto field 10 playersdueto
rashof illness. Littlefield won
the game over Dalhart 30-1- 8

but it went down as loss.
Vernon led the

way with 12 pointswhile Bryan
Pace and CharlesJackson
for six each. Cris Ayala and
Cliff Davis had tut) each.

In the second game Kress
took a 23-1- 1 beating at the

of the 'Cats. Tunnell
was high with eight pointsand
Jackson dropped in seven.
Trey Martindale and Pace
sank four each

Next Bovina fell to Little

Wildcats 6th Relays
Littlefield scored 45 points

to finish sixth in the Mustang
Relays at Denver City Satur-
day. Post won the meetwith 69
points.

Raymond Baiza was second
in the 330 yard intermediate
hurdles. Baiza and the winner
finished in a dead heat.
Baiza's time of 40 9 is the

best time in district
Rick Hopping was second in

both the shot the discus.
Terry Foley took fourth in the
discus while Bill Turner was
secondin the 220

Rogers earns spot
Dimmitt and Friona will

representdistrict A in the
regional golf meot. Dimmitt
won the district meot by firing
a teamtotal of 1717 the five
dtarkt tournaments.

Friona finished secondnine
shot back. Littlefield was third
with 1756 and Olton fourth at
1789. Next came Olton B' at
2O40 and Dimmitt B" at 2041
Morton did not play in all
district tournaments and

last
Wildcat Richard Rogers and

Olton s Wade Machen
representthe district in meda- -

Morton's 64.
The 'Cats finished secondin

all three relays, Arlene Wil-

liams, Walter, Sally Wil-

kinson and Jeanette Johnson
ran a 55 8 in the 440 relay The
880 relay teamof Poni Walter,

mano8cr. Martinez,
row

(.onzalez. Michelle Phillips

Williams

hit

field 28-2- Pace was top
scorerwith 12. Jacksonhit for
six and William four. Ace
Bridwell, Tunnell and Ayala
all had two each.

In the semi-fina- ls the Wild-

cats edged by Dimmitt 31-3- 0.

Trailing 8-- 2 after the initial
period, the "Cats rallied to tie
the game at 11-a- ll at half.
Littlefield took narrow one
point lead. 20-1- after three
quarters

Pace hit 13 points and
Jackson sank 10. Tunnell.
Davis. Williams and Martin-dal- e

all scored two each.
In the tournament finals.

Dalhart clipped Littlefield 32-2- 8.

The Maroon led 8-- 7 after
one period and 16-1- 4 at half
Dalhart took the lead 22-1- 8

after three periods.
Williams was high scorer

at
Louis Soria's time of 4:55.6

earnedhim sixth place in the
mile. The time is second best
in district and was the first
time Soria hadcracked the five
minute mark.

The mile relay team of
Baiza, Sammy Schlottman,
Jimmy Durham and Turner
turned in their best time of the
year with a 3:34.4 to finish
fourth.

The Wildcatsmet Muleshoe
in dual meet Wednesday.The
district meet will be held in
Friona April 22.

play. Rogersactually was
fourth with a 418 total and
Machen at 436, but
the two individuals not on
the first or second place team
advanceto regional.

Dimmitt's Keith Crumeshot
a 410 to take lop honors and
was followed by Frwna's Steve
Darnell with 412 Rogers and
Darcy Renner of Friona tied
for third with 418 totals.

Other Wildcats scores were
Kyle Jones. 437. David Cut-shal- l.

40O. Ricky Hooly. 400.
Hrent Jones. 475. and Van
Jacques.495
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DAVID THOMPSON

CandidateCommissioner Precinct 3

V Make Me Your &Q
y Commissioner A

II Work For" U" ST
ra roi aciv Dy uaviu J hompson

Ruthie Davis, Arlene Williams

and Jeanette Johnson com-

bined for a 2 03 4 Sally Wil-

kinson, Cindy Klein, Pamela
Fisher and Michelle Phillips

were in the mile relay at
5.03.2

i

a

a
a

I

with 12 points and Pace
for points. Tun

I L

r J

Cindy Klein brought home
three individual Miss
Klein was in the shot
put, third In the discus and
second In the 80 yard low

hurdles.
Poni Walter was double

HI

right,
Walter.

and On

and Davis.
Leader-New- s

hands

second

and

for

fin-

ished

will

for

lt
seventh

top

ac-

counted eight

medals,

nell, Davis and Martindale all
dropped in two each.

ANTHONY'S

mk

TO

ImaaaaVmTVaWwmaaam. mmtKrfl

I

long jump and the 60 yard

dash.

Linda Glover also a

first place medalby taking the

high jump. Miss Glover also

was fifth in the shot.
Armes took sixth in

the high jump while Sharon
fifth in the

880 yard dash. Arlene
in both

Five scored

35 or more points to lead

s

girls track teamthis season.

Poni Walter was high with

61 points while Arlene
scored 49 and

tallied 47

x

HAMILTON

HUNDREDS CHOOSE FROM

earned

Angela

Walbrick earned
Wil-

liams finished second

r

Jml

V
3

, i H
i ti i - 1 1 mmk t ani .

-
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dash.

second place in the 100 yard

dash while Sally

and Sarah Long third

and sixth, respectively, in the

event.
Miss Long also took sixth in

the yard dash.
was fifth in both the 80

yard low and the
yard dash

Five score 35 points for
seventh

Littlefield seventh grade

Wil-

liams Jeanette
Johnson

'.

8'

Jeanette Johnson copped

Wilkinson
placed

Phillips
hurdlos

7th

graders

Michelle

Cindy Klein added points

and Sally Wilkinson 35. Linda

Glover scored 24. Michelle

Phillips 17. Ruthie Davis 11.

Sarah Long six. Pamela Fisher

andSharon Walbrick four each

and Angela Armes three

A Vote For

FOR

TAX ASSESSORCOLLECTOR

Is A Vote For Economic,

Efficient Management.

Pd. For By FriendsOf Nilah Rodgcri

mKffa. .kcA
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NILAH RODGERS

;
JIM

iwiiwwMa

ifflwIif'Of

1R CTVl AT.

m

f

i- -

Phelps

N

f
'Jt

'
' f

I

v
l " TI

"
.iii

60

60

45

J

rr

1.

YOUR CHOICE

oi ilw. oitu 8 TO 20
m2?I0LIESTER D0UBLE KNIT WITH--- wn onuKi bLEEVES, TO ORDER.

r?fconi.ni

17

Vlfer

jWMHM

w
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on

AIR CON D SERVICnpj

- INCLUDES -

Cleaning Tub

Oil All

Hooking Up Water J

REG. $22-$-30

Bearings

Adjusting Float

Replacing Pads

All Pads And Parts Are Extra

Our Work Is Guaranteed

424 Ave. Lmefieid
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NEW FREE SERVICE!
Western Aiito h3 tha best r3i-i"S8s- a

Catalog orderingsystemin ass.i-- '
town' Yes, many Western
Auto Men can tell you in
seconds i! the major mer-

chandise item you want is
in stock andwhenyou can
expectto get it

All Deafen mi stock all

teat laewm. r Dm Rtm
ma? It temporarily ol ot
OKI. bi ttter cau. I
Ocaltr M m Uwi Is
arif I IM pa rraoafiT.

Ji

KS&MSB

II
pS'tV

5

I'JHIH'JIilHH1 4"Ij

SALE STARTSTODAY, ENDS APRIL 24!

!5fSr ,'SjHHf S5f Quality
MtMmmV- - HHHi

HI
SAVE NOW on3 HP.20 In. Mower-A- dd

It to Your WesternAuto Account!

PHttS AND TEWS OPTIONAL WITH DEALER

I 1 1 I mm I I I I m i p

1 a
Oil I ji

Regular94.95
Lightweight and easy
to Take ad-

vantageof sale price'
on99

Side steelcutting deck
14 to 3 in cutting height adjustment
Easy-to-rea- throttle is mountedon
chrome-plate- d tube steel T hand.'a

:clartfioqofvalue!

--- - --THsm save1.10 1 iSfiMlSfllnlBK
Spin-O-n

Filter...

Value!

handle!

discharge

&. TKW iiiiil value' io, iLJeffiBHIBIlBHKBHfliliHli
Lawn ChairWebbing AAH sizes to fit mostcars lS?295SBHHHWHrReguar59cVaueOniy.. "CV HiiHi Oil Filter Wrench 74-- teJHOhi MHIH Um
2V4in.x17ft.long.Save!5ow?" W 5925-8(- . . . 79c " vVHlH Hf

ffHBBBH wrV C OOw m SD B" IH iiBn o Aire rtt .410 J o

Jw' HoseNoafe WBRSSBJ 14 -- UseYour Credit! H
JHffii HOC flHfHlllHlH Regular94.95 Value Bf Q Q

sT ttffl ! it .Handcaliperbrakes 1'JjB gf ?1 FNV W
i lm OOKl AAf Safety rel lectorsystem w Hi1 r & c.3cn, DecoratorFence "JUv .26xiH.n. tires sOM Hpl1 jj 1Bf ?heS?ave. Wh.te plastic 30--

L. jJO. . Hasracing hand.ebars W J,
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SparkPlug 6-P-c. Cane COUNTY LEADER

PoleSet '' ' jd- -15
leslstor

"

Regular79c
Sizes for
mostcars'
Tune-u-p now
lor better
performance
andmileage'

Plug 0- 14(L) 79c

Regular
2.59

Value!

ii
ML

--y

"

i JHZ?
-

-- M

0169
LKiiiepumvviuiiiooK

bobber'

declarationof value!
fcjs"; (1HIB.fe --"Q

4lCKBII
-- .j imm,

'L. : '

I - Picture

selector! Qfe&L
3b mj

10(70)

for

ft 4(V)

y 12 ft c

g
f lina tmlfAr uiinHar

and

r
1

i

Zag

v
t? f

.1

1
H I ! 4nu ilr I t .5fe

1 '

a

nPHU WFSTFRN AIITffi information NAME.

maahibWi ADDRESS.
CHARGE ACCOUNT! contact promptly

.. I rtHL .L- - I . A. H
a Hl

ihtlli

SAVE
Choose"C"

"D" Cell
Battery

190
legular

Includes

&y

Bffl

U2

30.f2-A-D2- 4

24 NOW!

WOW! Zig
StretchStitch

jfj SewingMachine

rnflf
"

Jtoowar124.95Vbtoe
iSew buttonholes,blind,stitch
. without attachments'Auto--

malic self-sto- p bobbin winder.

A Simply fill in the
Z. at and ,l t0 us We

w.ll you

jj a
K.

kT M H

v

or

29c Buy!
'ower

r;

WESTERN AUTO
Wm

WE MASTER CHARGE

IAKXAMCRICARD

"l

rrittuus-- n;

ri9nt send
CITY

radios. ANt

Stock-u- p and

"f-i.-

m.

declarationof value! i

. . x :
hro-biy- ie

aluminum
tennis

Racket...

SAVE

300

years!

" A'
$

AS ON TV

31-5-

KG)

RegularS.99Value!
Lightweight, yet strong open--
throatdesign Has ruggednylon
strings Savenow'

SEEN

.PHONE NO.

Interested In owning your own store? Talk to
the store owner of. your local Western'Auto
Store...heH giveyou all thedetails! . .

Western Auto AssociateStores have
been serving America's families' 5for

overforty

AssociateStoreHomowna
RICHARD L WALL, JR.

306 Phelps-- Phone:-- 385-421 4
LiTTLEFIELD, TEXAS 79339

WS.C0JW CONVENIENT

CREDIT AVAILABLE

flashlights, toys
save'

MOrtCTteBriticUgilCTailCT,ffCl)CTmHNte33OTrtTDrtrttloct.lettOtt.r

w

99

t

a
j

; . .



3&"i
16 In. Lawn

Our best hose--

3&ift39BSK9MnHVl Spreader bias belted for maximum Big Savings
ChargeIt! durability: Top Quality

60 Ft. Hose

Reg. 11.95Value No- w-

Lig htweight& easyto ma
neuver unit has 30 lb.
capacity Positive action feed control. Big
6 in. wheels and tube steelhandle.

Regular 72.79 Vahiel Dual nylon rein-
forced vinyl for long service. Features
reinforced bias belt plus an interlocked
belt of tough cord. Rust-resista- brass
couplings. 400 lb. burst strength.

ifMU
t

tmtxx)

SROUPYOUR PURCHASES-A-DD 'EM TO YOUR ACCOUNT!

SdHHIK Wi wtuniM feLr1 .'i1 - 'sss IHB
U K Reifia9Ve g Vinyl 50' Vinyl GardenHose-

USE VV- - r K Handle grips Hasheavy-- Kose Regular 59 Buy fQ
YOUR ;jLS'rm nrihVe.b.rrow H''0" 'einfofced Q9S Set of Washer, JF"
CREDrry, iSSft JSbMWSS HasbrasscoupHngs. "ST

m V Fa,t BWpflk aJHk BMal- - r. flejur5.95

bfuegraxt Jr SsSI0A oyante v Sturdy N- - Coirers to ; "ts x.
mhluref X la- - JJ000-

- MWgg v S plattic! . 2,280 sq. ft.

2 Lb. Jiff Lawn Seed Lawn Fertilizer Only Pulsating Sprinklers OscillatingSprinkler
Reg. 1.45.' Covers up Afl fie9- - 5.99--20 lb. bag AQQ Reg. 4.55 Choose AOQ Our Better Sprinkler A 44
to 500 sq ft Save! Sfti Covers to 5000sq ft rt s,ed or spike-bas- e. bJa .6.99 &f

H LBIk YOUR CHOICE ste",hank' Steel Hose Hanger 6' RedwoodTrellis
BR kB3 ShOVel, Rake Or QQ fleg.B9cVafue ffe Reg.ZSSValue B f AkfHlX r9rWanUnannu Holds l0 10 ft Has 5 leaves that T HHW8 Se; "r of v m. d,ameterOS ,0,d-u- P ,or eas I X?
k. 1 99hW RegularValuot to 5.351 U hose.So handyl Vttr storage,movement owI A SMBF B 32301X) i3 TWESTCTM AUTO 2 SJ.---.-twlrnM,1MMM,MBM-

Mtr

"'JBl - jaflHMBHBBaEiMV



SAVE up to 7.00!
Our Extra-Wid-e Truck Tire
for IncreasedLoad Capacity!

QQ95
G 78--1 MI lube TrT 3 07 F E T

Regular40.95 Value!
Rugged nylon cord
body, deep Poly-B- D

tread(or long life
Reverse molded 78
seriestread for
traction,stability

JUSTCHARGE 'EM!
Be sure

to...
...askyour
WesternAuto
Man about
discontinued
treaddesign

j tire bargains!
i He mayhave
i othernew tires
I atspecial
low prices!

m nfl

7(V

ruat-rr- I fit I i mculm i sui i nus
ff RXTMG HUtMtH I PFUCt fHXt f IT

ito-is- it imiMOj j4on tin
44 13 39 93 3.21

K7H51I I 43.93 4193 35
T 43 93 41 (5 3.41

8 54 93 41 93 1W
lUHUJt flT STOCK MEULAft SU1 PIUS

Ut R4TMG HUMMR PHICI PWCt FIT
I 343.83 41 93 83.29

T 3 41 S3 43 93 3.53
8.66-11- 44 5 44J5 3 42
8 I 1M174-1I5A- ) 313 54 15 317

50-- 3 I I I 33 93 M IS 4J9
5 I I I I MtS UJ3 4 51

I 4 3 1 I 33 95 14 15 3.17

All prt rlil FUtrcl lulu T4X. Ma tridto regain.

Hi

El nL
1 1 3 -- OF

9 '.

I P3l

'rr HH

tiocx

Regular5.55 Vakiel

SAVE 1.11
Micro-Lub- e

GreaseGun

7 IP A44
WrjK- -

Completewith one
greasecartridge'
Develops to 7,500
lbs. of pressure.
3 Extra Cartridges

1.29

3

ft fl "K

SAVF

Tl 81 bet0T 4 eep-Dis-n "Gyro"
I CustomWheels...Charae'em!

Regular42.95 Each...Now4 For...
14x6 in for 5 hole on 44 or 4 bolt
holediameter castaluminum
15i7 1487 Setof 4 68(0 1M.99

Sandblaster...Rough
Terrain Tires(or Your

Rough TerrainVehicle!
49 95 4 22 1 1 1

7 2(5A)39 952371e t
I M) 49 13 3 37 1 1 1
9 5 S3 93 2 691 e t

IMrRjlrt FtitodWHUtttir&j
Ha Tredt-f-e Kqmt

KR w

bvt.bf Man.

Why Wait?
Buy theTires

You NeedNow
and Save!Add
Them To Your
WesternAuto

ChargeAccount!

IT

SAVE NOW on Nylon Cord Boat
TrailerTires...Use Your Credit!

4 8074 00-- T8t Tfft 9 88 53c I c I
4 804 08--8 TBtdtss 14 M 3c l
5 T.00--1 Tiltltu 28 88 95c 1 1 1
3 71MM Tltlt TM 1(5) 18.83 . 82c ' C t
4 804.00-1- 2 Tt Tim 16.83 76cl e t
4 HV4 2 Trititsi 1S.33cltl
SJC4SS-- Tibdcn 19 13 1 02 1 1 1

MTrtd-laRrirt- 4

,

eli' For most PS
, in. fres! Bf

MM
SAVE on Rugged
Butyl Tire Tube

11

3

-2--

82(A)

pkj21c't
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Ooublo Insulatod
andUL approvedI

Hascomfortablefront androar
grip handles- contouredfor
loft or right handuse

50 PowerCord 2 wire 53--
3917-U4- J) 5.99

I I

'iT' -- '' I I

rCcS!? .j' I --&- right WX2125 handle I

ggjigV ScatfopedtooOidesign.'
tmmm. Repl.Blades 3.99 1

" YUR CH0,S tfl HereKls-theBt-ric
Cordless f&Mmjr I 1 "WedEater"Trimme-r- i i
11 "Trimmer ory WP MmmUmm it to Your Account jj
Upright Shears- P"!., QQ95

mMmmI jmmmW& til mi

- Of" I Model 400 MM afeffcEr Wades.'
A Mi HP Uo3 i

Both feature
Black & Decker

quality and
durability! F'mMP 11 Weed W-

-JIHmlr 1 nylon cutting

Double EdgeShrubTrimmer w
energypak & recharger Light-
weight wwrap-aroun- d handle
Upright Shearswith energypak
& recharger Scissor-lik- e cut-
ting action andsafety switch

& Decker
8" Electric Lawn Edger
for Lovelier Lawns!

HP. motor! J QQ
Makes " deepSA1VV
trench.Con-
vertseasily to

under bushes shrubs.
Power Cord

DODO'OCCfri nOrnamentaldeslgn-36x12V"h- igh!

x
Wire Lawn Fence
Reg.2.59

In green
or white

199

fcNv recharger!

yifi mmW" Converts tout)--

9C. Add

0 Scalloped Jroot. 1

Black

awitx) Bol Eatersfeature: L
M

50 Ft

h mi m. mm inai
f Features I mmmmmmm "fishing line"!

durable Ml Wmmmmummmmm grass-tn- m rocks'
A housing! mi Hi

'
m I l nf.lM Jmj1

t " SWWSSfckiki RSfefc' "sgif

rK T. . ;
'? i i ... eager... . r.

' -- 9,m0- b jr-- m m nr

mWw IlliM ?7 1
H v ay --

"
, Pmmm mower... sweeper!J w Ar .
&mmWjF J ! ' -

trim and

.7.99

10 Ft. 18 In.

II

09W)

T"'

neaas sioremono
jj

over

ij
"miner

jxii --ixs.

9203- -

fc 1pr

Decorative

Easy-to-us- e,

"fisftlngtoe"

BUY AU OF YOUR LAWN GARDffl NEDS
NOW & SAVE...USE CONVENIENT CREDIT!

I

k save90c XSSSmmWMSSMBSSB

"''ntJ aqq nnfc knrBTTi

PfTuftnifTHJ
Carbon steel blades 13 in
long Has safety thumb lock

Teflon-Coate- d Grass Shears
12' L

4.99

trimsgrassfast.
trims closeto
trees,sArubs,

fences& walks!

100'PowerCord

&

I n

92.wssV v Regular
79 50(XV SkV to 95C

JES.rUrS.u,, WESTERN AUTO 3



96
Cfi

With
brass
screw-o-n

connector!

SAVE 70
4-W- ay

Rim Wrench

169

SAVE 70 NOW
HandyTire Pump

Reg.
2.49

18 m
hose

179
15405- -

Pump 20 in hose

.Mill
TJW' Regular

SS. 2.39 Buy

W 3 deeplug nut
jMT socketsplushandy Mprying tool! 4

otct www mm 9BT

Account Now!
OurDemon XL bolted tire haspolyesterbody pliesand
2 fiberglassbelts to helpkeeptreadflat on road
Belts placeddirectly undertreadto give addedtrac-
tion, excellentstability, handlingcharacteristics
Poly-B-D tread rubberresistsabrasion

BLACKWAU. I STOCK I REGULAR I SALE I FEDERAL
TUBELESS NUMBER PRICE PRICE EXCISETAX

A71-1- 3 UM JTT55 J1.7S
E7S-1- 4 36-9- 2545 77
F79-1- 4 M 95 2145 2.43
GTt-1- 4 424S JIM 240
Q78-1- 5 (111 3345 us

WHITEHALL STOCK REGULAR SALE FEDERAL
TUBELESS NUMBER PRICE PRICE EXCISETAX

ATt-1- 3 $3445 52245 l 75
B7-1- J 3545 2X95 142
C78-1- 4 35 95 2445 245
D78-1- 4 37 95 2645 2.12
E78-1-4 3195 2845 247
F78-1- 4 42.15 3145 2.43
G7I-1-4 45 95 3445 2.60
H7-1- 4 49 95 345 243
078-1-5 48 95 35.95 2.85
HTt-I-S 50 95 39.95 2X7
J78-1- S 52.95 4195 341
L76-1- 5 55 95 44 95 314

fta

An prtcei ptu FederalEjtclte Tax andtrade-I- n !

WHY WAIT FOR NEW TIRES?
CONVENIENT CREDIT AVAILABLE!
It TzaaKKm&T&r'ETry7s7r'm
l XxaaaWeVeWeWeWeWeD vAViC ms'JCvCr aB

1V xVHBK vyy" a wyfr m
r sa WVB. aaaWBBBBBBBBBBlex VbV.- xa xLx Vk Mr' --Val WaeaJI laMMMMK YV --3jTJP aw

gBA B aMHHM Oy ' )X W

Han bbbbbbbbbbbbbK tjC"alC aril 'BaaaJf

' " jaaxexBaaaaaaavSxBaatBaaS
""aWawWx"4

4-P-ly Nylon Cord
Tires Charge

ThemandSave!

1Q95
BBImmbIBBiBBi xexexl

1431 ti.
tiOtaUra.

S313EwJTut)dJ

SAVE
to 25

Safety
Sentry

Tires Have
4 nylon cord bodyplies
plusa twin treadpat-
tern for excellent
traction, long life on
wetor dry roads

Sizesfor mostpopularcars
alsoavailablein 12 in. and
for Volkswagens 1

BLACKWAU STOCK REGULAR SALE FEDERAL
TUBELESS NUMBER PRICE PRICE EXCISETAX

640x12 120.49 J164S Illo
640x13 1149 1X9S 143
745x14 24.49 20 9$ 147
7.7514 25.49 2145 2.12

28.49 224S 243
--55x14 29 49 26.95 243

548x1$ 22.49 18.95 141
7.75x15 28.49 2245 2.10
4Sx1S 27.49 2345 249
45x1S 29 49 2545 2.44

WHITEWALL STOCK REGULAR SALE FEDERAL
TUBELESS NUMBER PRICE PRICE EXCISETAX

840x12 12X49 S204S 5140
5.60x15 I 2S49 I 21 95 1 181

All pricesplut FederalEidta Tax andtrade-i-n tire.
sportSentry treaddesign(not thown).



i t" - r "!r

Power
propelled!

In.,

-- b
m

Drive controls for safety front
wheelpinion drive for no-sli- p traction

decks fully baffled for ex-

cellentg rass
Ultra-li- ft bladecreatessuctionto lift grass

for more evencut
rear wheels

Wizard & Tillers ..over5 million sold!

20 H.P.
Loadedwith features
like fotdtng 'loop
style handletor stor-
age Use your credit

fingertip height
Full battled deck for easy grass dts
charge easy-rol- l 7 in wheels

133.99

l

AUTO

aam- -hv easyVH
312 H.PTP

operator

Side-dischar-

discharge

upright
Convenientself-cleani-

Mowers

Deluxe ln.312 Mower

129
adjustment

22ln.Model93-6322-7(2X-)

AV

HO

kti Una m) uocktt
WicUy atiitaMl tram

mi ntritetiaa irh

lAc.al
s w

22

WESTERN

kIWiF

Now

operate!
ower Propelled

1399WM-WH-)

fordependableperformance.

Hl

1iiiHiiii2b.

Mower

99

YOUR
CREDIT

SAVE 14.96
H.P. "Total Trim"

Regular

tv imsrK ss innvHii3LHHiiHLRLBHLlLLLLLLB

IftbbbbbBBIbbbM

99
ultimate trimming

fences, anything!
,4H.P.93-6624-6(2X-).. ..249.99

discharge

catchers
wheels
"flush"

trimmino'

Mfc ' ' ryTyif Folding handle!
Includes catcher. MBSSS"

4

j

K

L So lightweight'
men M IIMH

f

MWGE WTB

IdeaUor
imaf varrl! ChargeItl

to

USE

on 20 In.
312

Only
Our mower trim
close to trees,

Rear
deck,grass

deep
inset
allow

grass

SAVE 4.96 on 18 In
Regular89.95 Value Now
Powerful 3V4 H.P engine
has easy-spi- n recoil
starter Handle-mount-ed

84
throttle control. Adjustable cutting
GrassCatcher95--1 109-0(4- .
ReplacementBag 95--1 1

8 In. easy
roll wheels!

20 In.
Regular119.95 Value

3'2HP Briggs Stratton
engine for power Side

deck fully bat

--

1 t

&

tled for excellent grass
SAVE 9.96! 22 In.

1-- he

lawn

adjustment!

mmKmZ

Quiet
3H.P.

handle

Mower

67- -

7(H)

12.99
6.49

AVAILABLE

SAVE on Mower

discharge 109
discharge

tVIIHr

99

99
962
2H)

114.99

In quiet
care!

J!kkkkHkkkkkkkikkkkkkkkkkkkHI
brfT-MHHB-

Mr

20 In. Electric Lawn Mower
electric operation

Dependable engine.
Lightweight! Convenient

mounted throttle

height

CREDIT

9.96

84

Reliable'

Ultimate

95
controls. Chromed loop style handle. Hurry!
SAVE 2.96on 100' Cord 12.99



fieg.
28.99

I

T

Reg.
4.99

Auto CB Antenna
Mounlson AAQQ
cartrunk! 700!
CarRadioAntenna

Springsback QQQ
Universal fit fi

8(30) V

Mfcifl

required

ChannelMini-Siz- e Transceiver
UseYour Credit Right Now!

CB

Equipped Chan
9 (national emergency).

2 open channels Complete
push-to-tal- k mike, mounting

bracket, 64

OurBestTare--ToughOne
Sloe!8eKefi Radiai

Add Setto Your Account!
Regular48.95 Vahie!

Be preparedfor new
driving comfort, ease
of handling and
control with a set of
thesefine tires'

HR70 14

3 Mobile CB
Enjoy

only.

to

a

tor 23 op

36

WW

5715

S5 J5

UH

7t5

SJUf
PHicr

42 70

11 75

sa
50 S

50JO
54.20

1145

ah ii pii f Mtrai licut In art lut

all

TuMospkn
2 28 It ISIndt--

Tests that carsequippedwith oursteel belt'
edradial gotmore miles-per-gall- than those
samecarsequippedwith ourbestnon-belte-d tire
Radialconstructionpractically eliminatestread
squirm,themajor causeof treadwear
Ruggedsteelbelting keepsthetreadflat against
the roadfor greattraction,handling...polyester
cord plies run cool for long-lastin- g service

WHITlWUi.
mmtss
MTt-1-

CRTS-1-4

HOT-1- 4

HR70-I- 5

HR70-1-

JR7D-I- 5

IR70-1-

STOCI
MUMHR

7(24)

1H90S-II2-)

RfCIAAft

WftS

J.

J1U5

tnft--

PIUJ flDtML
ixcnt im
an
2 74

213
3.M
3.13
3.13
3J5
3.54

313

tires...more than 67million safer...trtMted!

""KSggSS - Automatic ---- niiHBI FCClicense Ip?
' filMB I controland ) HIBIHI fft,

dJEH --- limiter! S ll !
! fCC cense LUHNHfetV

to It
Enjoy living lor

with crystals(or
nel highway
Has
with

hardware

great

prove

body

GR7S-1- 4

1HM1

MM

US

7t5
75.15

4415

W.A.

88
SAVE 1 9.96on 4 Watt23 Channel

Mobile CB Transceiver
ReguarJ59.95
Complete with
necessarycrystals

channel
eration'Antenna
warning

139

95

99
9(D)

gSSrTSiJWBtHM AUTO 37'

K

f5
gain noise

light
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o n.r. nearengine pviaQl
Riding Mower.. .Add It pSJ"spBJHlfiff To Your Account Now! "JtWhL

BLMflHIMalmttlB JKb. Regular459.95 Vaue

e 3 Ar fennot i stock tMiktfr ml-- V
aMt bnat IsMMIm cater, flv

fev mB

biBMb
.,'

UseYour Credit and
Enjoy ThisRight Now!

26 in. floating cut-
ting deck for smooth,
even lawn mowing
Single lever height
adjustmentof 1 V4--3 in.

seat

Popular6 H.P. Single-Spee-d

Tractor-Styl- e Riding

-- Bfct?Mfcfc
rEVlBVH3flB2E51Eii9fli

umuWmmLmBtMaWmaaWm

Lawn Mower

A7Q99
Regular524.95Buy

26 in. floating cut-
ting deckwith single
lever cuttingheight
adjustmentof 1 V4--3 in.
1 speedforward with
neutral,reverse...
auto-typ-e differential
Pneumaticrear, tic

front tires
Contouredpaddedseat

3-Sp- eed Rider...
UseYour Credit!

579

WB

mBaW.

Contoured

5 HP.Tractor

Ideal for small
lawns, yet it is
packedwith big
mowerfeatures!

95
8ZX)

Regular629.95Vaue
34 in. twin bladecuttingdeck
hassinglelever cuttingheight
adjustmentfrom 1 Yi to 3V4 in.
Reliable rack andpinionsteer-
ing andsure-sto-p discbrakes
Parking brakeandbladedutch
Pneumatictiresfor goodtraction

8 H.P. Riderwith
Electric Starting

7CQ99lug?
Regular83435Value
Full 38 in. twin blade
adjustablecuttingdeck.

NEW FREE SERVICE! Western Auto has
the bestCatalog orderingsystem in town I

Many Western Auto Men can tell you in
secondsif the major item you want is in
stock& whenyou canexpectit)

Why Wait?Use
Your Credit!

Ja KIf9frBaaaaaaaaJm

l o

Style Riding Lawn Mower

38999
OCX)

25 In. fixed cuttina deck Is manuathr HhithJ
Single-spee- d transmission,easyrecoil starting

SAVE 10.96! Dump Trailer 59.99
SAVE 6.76! GrassCatcher95--1 120-5(4- 3439

niiMentt ..,, . , , . -

IUI nuiunHIIUJ



NEW FREE SERVICE!
Western Auto has the test Catalog ordering system in
town Many Western Auto Men can tell you in secondsif
the majormerchandiseitem you want is in stock& when
you canexpectto getit!

SAVE 3.96 NOW! SolidStateAM
Auto Credit!
Regular 23.95 Vauo-Relia-ble solid AAAstate chassis' Lighted slide-rul- e tun-- J2I9
ing built-m4i- n speakerbavel

WESTS! AUTO 36 m wjnaj
H V 1(D)

Our Best Tire with
Polyester

aSetTo Account!
Regular31.95!
Get
economicalser-
vice now at our
low, Declaration
of Value prices!

Extra Speakers

ul

121
Ejck

tnde-- n

LPSH features4 piles of tough polyester
cord for Improvedmileage, driving
Roundedshoulderdesignfor excellentsteer-
ing control and Improvedhandling
RuggedPoly-B- D tread rubberresistscutting
andabrasionfor low cost-per-mi- le service
Wide, flat, slotted treadfor greattraction

KACHMU. STOCK KfiUUR UU TUti FtDERM.wow wtwtw rwct rwct posttu
Arm m tna mint4 i)s in
C7t-i-i m nn zn
G7MS nja yn
HTs-- ts a tu

wmrrwAa reguua uu ruaraciui.
Tutaiss wmaot nag wag pcstux

Q4t 4t SI 71
S7I-- Mtt "tT lit
TJt--n n7M6-ii- a aits n)
07S-- ng Hi
nui ww a zti
F7H4 40 W 21W i.)i
C7H4 4J.M TT r5
K7H4 i4 g Hi

t0-- WW g4 III
tJ0-- a 1ST
C7HS 47 tS j i j it

DM g W MS

J7HS 47 M MM i
17HS an

Ml Im FtOrjl EniM Tu ra todt-f- e tm. HC
ENJOY SALE SAVINGS-U-SE YOUR CHARGE ACCOUNT!

Radio...UseConvenient

Bias-Pl-y

Cord
Add Your

dependable,

SAVE 9.96 NOW! with ElectronicAutomobile
Speakers...Add It To Your Account! BurglarAlarm For...
Regular 79.95 Value Burglar alarm
protects against theft Has matrix QQ
eminH if 9 ovlra cnaakare am arilaM 69 0 4

2 B.88

comfort

H"hT

mH

stock

W11

Mri

ttH

H7HS

pricn

Regular9.95 Vaue
Preventstheft I

Activates carhorn.

TMetj174
1 1 1. 1

i ?

.

?

8



If josr use USE
Add this Low Priced YOUR H

YOUR

?! u&rueu ouiuvciiur ;Al CRED1T1

to Your Account!
CREDIT! Or Rugged12"

& ChainSawRegular SEE W!lJMJ41.95 TILLERS x
Value 5NPG.8!

Includes cultivator plow and re-

versible shovel adjustment
changes angle and depth of cut
Sturdyframeof chromedtempered
stee 24" spoke-support- wheel

AlBMio(la8Ktliic!jmtMi

I

n- - i i ar p 1liMnih
Features automatic rewind starter.

119
carburetor. 3d handy!

14 .ChtaSwBuilt rugged1 ely140.9S
t 8 oz-ca-

rt 95-7-1 Fie Set95--7 ).. 3.99

Lopping
Shears

Reg. 7.95
27 in long
Cutsup to
1in da

-- '".. .

G49 r- -
USE YOUR CHARGE ACCOUNT FOR SPRINGTIME NEEDS!

a Jti no fl zr-r?-& SSvuC!--ft -1JI WS&W 1 12V Tractor BatteryVtT OrthoWeed-B-Go-n $T VV Re93t.9sAAQQ
Reoular19.49 Keepyour AQQ Regular 89c Value' Fits 37amosof

-- 1 3'galcapa-- lawnweed-- C fc 1 most lawn mowers. Save' A c.., I.V t,cfl

city 48 in freeiPt " srmr "Mr Pwer r"s
eTcoooq --- --- mostgardentractors Save'hose 18 rod

Vfjn. JXJfr
G-'d- en Gloves... ftftC Mjl With SparkPlug!

N"90-
- IJOIf Regular "1 7H 7171 Reguar2.99 JB

'49Bu,r I WW'J flMffl For Br.ggs a OAHPre.eeded-u,afer'f-lll Patterned oo fleguaM.59 9PK Strattonen- - JtTf
VWESTERNAUTQ6 5JJJB.

C,,n' Sturdy steel 8" g,nes Save. fc "flj'



ftflKr 'Zm'vP" J" 99 Sturdy Xv
3.99
R&aular

BuvSALE 16 stainless
steelwith

VX "V

SAVE 96cNOW bail orangle
SAVINGS-U-SE tip 2" diameterReg 22 95 All sixesoneprice! Muffler QQ

Engineered to provide ellic-en- t
48 In. Scavenger1YOUR CREDIT! performance Double-wrappe- zmc-coat-ed Tailpipes

with spun-o-n end caps.Save1 Reg.2.65 Buy 3.99

Durable
white
enamellL& j

,v j
r,

V Mirror

RanulAr
IS if 9g

3.00
ni

Truck

899
Chromed 14.99

Wp
SAVE 1.96 NOW

DC Timing Light Only
"eg J9.95

Shock-proo- f

solid state
6& 12volt

'"

SAVE

17 0(R)

20c

79

99

SAVE

Carburetor
Cleaner

7M95?--
ran- -

Regular99c
Worksquickly'
Comes in 15 oz
easy-pou-r can

Connectors

SEE WESTERN AUTO FOR YOUR TRAILER NEEDS!
111! rr,

(A) Connector Plasticcas-

ing 6. 12V 1.49
(B) TrailerWire Connectors
6, 12V 99c

Connector 2.99

SAVE 3.96NOW
DwellTach Tester...
Reg. 17.95 flflAOOChecksenginelf 99uwenaiuic H Wk

to in leaas

1

i SAVEj
fe 36c

ill n,"91"6

p 129
MMJl Regular1.65

PMS
J 16oz spray

(A)MAA Mi --S: i(f)

D!R!

m ki.i mm, a sm l - v - '

Szes
most

cars!

t i rk?L.t

ConnectorKit with wires &

brackets 6.99
(C) Universal Trailer Wiring Kit
6 12V 64-28-1 3.49
Mount Tape 2.49

ui can

fo
fit

Vent Filter

?Sd

12c
ATF Fluid Only

RegularEEC

im

CQC fjQ
transmissions

I

Filler

wmm MSI SAVE!

"fig(P NMiififfjgaMotor

Air Filter

6020-7(-

SAVE

SilrWwinHv'"Vi7-'- :

IHillllllH
GROUP YOUR PURCHASES-AD-D 'EM TO YOUR ACCOUNT

.

Vh In. Hitch Ball
1.99

Class Trailer Hitch
Reg. 18.49 12.99

Ball Coupler 6.99

1T1II il

ATF Sealer&
Conditioner

Absorbs

v
Painted

Custom

OH-tHm.-
,.

ssmrff1

WA

5 lb. Absorbent
Reg.
85c67c

For

7(LVtQrt.

(D)

(E)

(F)

99c

O

oil & greasequickly'

Wearwell
PJ Bf Oil

74-- vSI
99C 'H) Reg. 59c Buv

I PJPPPPPHrQuart size can

OfMNU MTM MAlf- WESTBN AUT035



Electric FenceCharger
Regular32.49AAQQChargesup to
25m.es' CMjW
Quality 19 GaugeFenceWire
Vi mile 7.99

&C Bg

Roundor SquarePlanter
Regularto 95c
4v diameter
orsquare
Buy both'

c66!

SubmersibleSumpPump
Regular44.95
Pumpsupto
1300 gallons
perhour1Use convenientcredit'

SAVE S2c NOW!

Handy20 In. Leaf Rake
Reg. 1.95Value
Has flat sonna

'360 ctcwkl tinoe nnrl,w ....t-J- !::wiue &weufj"

MXl

aui

Kit

i il a i'i 1 1 1
' i a I a 1 1 1 i h ?

i i

(A) SAVE 1.00 Power Rake ConverterBlade
Reg.3.59 For mostmowers 2.59

(B) Mower or Tiller Reg.Values to
Built to last From 2.99 to 5.99

(C) SAVE 20c Gumout Carburetor
Cloanerfieg. 7.69 12oz.78-6954-8(2- 1.49

(D) SAVE 50c StartingFluid Reg.
1.29 11 oz. spray .. 79c
(E) SAVE 55c Lawn Mower BladeSharpener
Reg. 7.99 V. ?ra in dnlls. 1.44

(F) SAVE 26c Lawn Mower StarterCord Reg.
1.7542 in nylon cord. 89c

39

1

99
9M60S--

33

Sl
gjTRlgfil

SAVE 19.96 NOW! Popular10x7 Ft Storage
Building...Add it To Your Account& Save!

Features long-lasti- tnple-nbbe-d steel con-

struction Gabled root provides good drainage.
Has nt enameledfinish

10x10Ft
14x10Ft

titter suiter Anchor 24.99

li ill i7i k'f i Jj' ;h7 il V hVt ;hWH h iTJiB

G L

6.49

Mower

Dependable

14999

Barn-Sty- le

Regular249.95 99099

(Dir SAVE to 1.46 --N
SJJPIot Mower-- y

Ttggm Blade jmafx

B
, -- " yfil

Made to ,ast C0"1 in sizes
.nX. fWBs f" to fit mowers. L

(G) SAVE 69c ReplacementThrottle Control
Reg.2.35 5ft casing,wire 1.66
(H) Quality Siphon Pump Reg. 89c Sturdy
plasticwith 6Vt ft hose 59c

(J) SAVE 66c Sound-Deadeni- PowerMower
Muffler Reg.7.65 95-12- 46(4X) 99c

(K) SAVE 31c! Universal ShoulderBolts Reg.
7.79 Card of 2 88c
(L) SAVE 36c 8x1.75Gear-Trea-d

Mower Wheel Reg.285 2.49

(M) SAVE 36c 7x1.50 Replacement Mower
Wheel Reg.2.35 1.99

gtilCeclBJcttVJn--

Regular

StorageBuilding
StorageBuilding

10x10FL StorageBuilding
Value

Enameled steel construction'

I69LSS Value!

189.39
259.99

Now...

xPower

most

SAVE Ymm
Power Ymk
Mower RBf H

-- J oil ijrJl
ReguarVafuesto.95cWGt I

Choose2 or Qt fcB Itf I
Pour 'n' Store Cap 15-- M ?f I

25c --
""

it ft
- "" IIM1 .hi, . - i .

OWM MTM MAUI) VW E3 CV1 AU IU r



"" Cm RIDE LIKE Regular6.99
S4C

Value
4R!

Original Stcttour for 2NEW! replacement
equipment

wheels'Most cars
quality! and light trucks

s LTG BrakeShoe.. 7.99

SAVE

300
Life GlydeShocks Charge'Em!
Regular8.99ValueNow
With deluxefeatureslike:

Strongweldedsteelbody
with Vz in hardenedpis-
ton rod for strength1
Positive sealfor even
shockabsorption'
Sizesto fit mostcars!

Ignition Tune-u-p Kit
Reguar3.45Vaue

Completeand easy'
For use with most
6. 8 cylinder cars

1

rteamkittoctk

9 920)

Reg.1.4$ .ZEXl

BatteryPost& JSsw,
TerminalCleaner

A 1

M WESTB3N AUTO 34 prwcyg worn wut h

PiJ
jMtlr mlaWt T:!B

SparkPlugCables
Reg.9.99 Vaue
ForBcyl cars
roroi.jri.04--
2100.01(1.) 4.89 160)

YOUR
CHOICE

5

Ammeteror Oil
PressureGauge

Regularto 4.39

89

2 in dials 6 or 12V systems

1
SAVE 2.60 NOW

Disc Brake PadsOnly
Reg.73.59

Setof 4 for
2 wheels Most
cars, trucks 1099

7W2U
SKS)

PlugSocket AA0
Reg. 55c Value Hist
ix3V4- - 14mm 0k 7aj

$ Plug Gap
W4 Gauge

i - nnT
Regular1 29.

jTBAflHBP i
?wjrS nfltafbkj r

239 Regufar(o4.39 9 SQ
J, For most autos 76.MIJ.

Emission Control Hm 5S)

Model Cap 76-8- 4 3.69

SAVE 37cNOW

3

to 115

Fits most6 and8
cylinder models.

M

"StopRite"
Brake Fluid

Only...

88
Regular125

Top quality fluid
delivers safeand
reliable stopping
power' 12 oz can

iirrTHBHriuiimivrk&ivihitHOi-i- l

Distributor CapOnly...
Regular

CHARGE YOUR AUTO FIX-U- P NEEDS AND SAVE NOW!

LockinqGasCaD.

M

1

SAVE 30c
WD-4- 0 Spray
Penetrating
Oil Only...

160
Regular1.99
Stopssqueaks&

protectsmetal
parts-lot- sof

uses'Comes in
1 1 oz. aerosol



1

r

Regular298.95Buy

Featurescenter-mounte-d

ctutch
for easyperattonT

Checkour
complete
selection
for all of

your lawn
andgarden
supplies!

Forward,neutral
andpowerreverse
locatedon single
control handle!

THBiB Ui

5 HP BnggsandStratton Kool-Bor- e engine
Hassixteen14 in. diameterbolo-typ- e tines
that till a swathfrom 12 to 26 in. wide
Engineweightcenteredovertines (or maxi-
mumpenetrationandbettermaneuverability
Double steel framefor lastingvalue

jHjB&4i3oKEt&4lBnKBSE32SE3KBE$SBEitiUBK2l .53(2

Opena
.. WesternAuto

-- Account
"S-.- Todayl

Sixteen14
in slasher

yff aT AffBHIMla
JP ngctbcMCkiT

fT ftsmttaacniB

dWrvf Act ill

Regular

SAVE 29.96 NOW! Rugged
5 H.P.ChainDrive Tiller

289lype lines
till apath Wl
26 in wide Easyrecoil starting

21195

99

fAJ

Use
Your

Credit!

&

mic9ii
Regular

SAVE 39.96 NOW! Our
5 H.P. Tiller

Sixteen 14

in slash-
ertines
till 426

f
wle" fc E

339.95

9QQ99
t-u-&

in path 2 forward speeds. reverse

: -- 4 1

w

1

fleg.
7.09

Regular3I5Sox
Briggs aStratton
enginewith ver
tirat conedrive
Sixteen 12 in. dia.
bolotirwstiHa
12toa61n.ph
FaatufwaMy-pi- n

rtoMstMMo

AddTbfc
To Yoht.

Account!

& li

AMD

4w

SAVE 20c
Tiller Oil

89'
140 wt Vipt can

9SSM6 1X)

"i

M
"

r

ttr

SAVE 1.60
Furrow Opener

Regular
&S9

L

fi iHwrt
we i J

sz

j99

tw I MVT

rd4 for Light
Gardening

Needs!

flegaar 1 7X95 Vahte!
Qriggs& Stratton
enginewith easy
recoil starting

- 9 in. steeltines
till aswath10. 14 --- or

full 18in. wide

SAVE 6.96
Til-Ro- w Attachment

Reg.
41.95. 199

4X)

NEW FREESERVICE!
Western Auto hasthe bestCata-
log ordering system in town!
Yes,many Western Auto Men can
tell you in seconds if the major
merchandiseitem you want is in
stock and when you can expect
to get it'



S

Powerful!

HandyAuto Vac

V'toe Sm o-a-

Lightweight, easy-to--

opcrale Picks up dirt
and lint easily 14 It cord

.Available
In white,
redand

.blaek!
-- 61(C)

Auto Pin Striping
Reg. 79c Buy

40 it rolls
of Vu'orVwidth

BacJr, red
or gold!

Handy Litter Basket

no

Heguar7.45 ftStay
place' hits
over hump

I

- Pfugsnfol
, any 12 volt 1

A cgarefrel
X lighter!

north
mtiMti

characters

Illuminated
Auto Compass f

Reg.

Now
fS9

q

Mounts oasily
to windshield
or dashboard
with
disc bracket'

battery

Cartop RackOnly
Reg.74.99Value gf fe QQ

Aluminum, enamel-- J K)
ed steel 36x5x "ff8""" '36 deep Has
rubberpadsto protectcar finish

' uv r -
k. X ;. .11 .'Til;

in

in

s

CartoonAir Freshener
99c Now

fresh scent

5.49
Buy

Save'

2 In. dial fe
illuminatedlor

nighttimeviewing!

HI

9.49 Solid
back

128
tubo

steel
with

seat
&

vinyl black

USE YOUR CREDIT TO SAVE ON THESE M.UES!

69

99

Luggage Full-siz- e Carpeted Mats
1X95 Value Now fe

Fit p. With
carpet insets, i

ao .Mi' m&wif&mi

?

Safety

Sk
000

&gB&rHjiw vvhodi'jr E&3K
Regular
Colorful
provide

adhesive

79c
split styles

BabyCarSeat

Regular20.99

Sturdy
frame

padded
back,

headrest
Wipe-clea- n

brown

Car
Regular AJ1

H 3 1 !i n 3

snst
no-sli- p

backs.Chooseblack, brown blue,green.7

v, jm .-

a I

"- ---.

I

i l

SeatCover

Regular or
In

black, blue or brown I

or

SAVE

800

fa rKLfi 1 1 1 1
1 1

IjHfe SAVE 14c

lHI BeveragejB Holder...

E

1 H 1HUI Hi
I IHf WasticCup22- - I

SPSS u3 I H 1 1 1 n 3 !f

B SAVE 1 .06
B Cool Cushion

Argyle Front rHHH

r nisgLrrsvj wmauii MW033V



II

Assembles
paslhr In .

minutes!

V JS6
KIDS'LL LOVE THIS

-J-UST CHARGE IT!

V

THE

"M fl tt&xi (f I Jl Isl a o fe
'

- fLl

i awdBa if ff o t-- !& h

Regular

perfectlanding of

SAVE

reartAccounil

3w s
Regular67.95 Price
Designedto ol fun
tor theyoungsters.

2 swings, ladder
er trapeze&

6 ft in.
Dura-Ko- ol plastic
resistantnylon bearings'
Sturdy 11 ft 10 ta
top barand 7 ft

6 Gym Set Onl- y-

2 swings USky- - fcaacna
Skooter

assembleseasily
Anchors

I ff W SAVE 9.96 SAVE NOW ,0U Giant Gym Set-Cha-rge CompactGym Set tJri ;f4
"W&CIQ wl4 JI JIA Vt" S

Has XS"""?' UflTtfglider. 'J. swing! ffl T "" " S&? 3i tandem nds,'de"1 . Jk;?Lr?. N"rl trapeze big 7' tmcM. seats4 striped Your
cttf laJ . Credit!

Tvi2r PolySandBOX I I I , Dura-Ko- ol
1 1 fleg.7.95 .BabySwingrlraS fl7otfilQCI lPaStK! Swing... jl- - , SeatOnly

1 "V Box 32-- flR ,Bn

I ," 19.99 Comfortable, IB Plasticwith' ' - L31 safety

T:r"s3nMBBHMiHMHH I fl - -

MAVAvHAV (MJ7 ' uTKaBi vift.HBMotorno.se Jb- -
to Your Account! easy-- " I r'Fr"A Of Frtb...

Evel Knievel Stunt Cycle Jfel V M a X .A15.44
jumps,

& wheeliesl Gyro-act.-

fun!

PL Low
providehours

Features:
swing

6 platform
rust--

tube steel
legs'

and
Dura-Ko- ol Dlastic

Set
4 439

' 5.51

It! No- w- C

VL
flegufar

Y
2 and UseW

and sl.de.

Canopy I 6L99 0 7C)
3026-5(2- I

I -- V

Regular3.19
N S

Add This and A
rol,whee,s

a

KI99 JBRl G2sil?oBRr,-X- ? sjdit
Hours

slide'
seats,

seats.

U 89.95 Valu- e-

non-t.- lt

legs

Sand fleg.
no-ti- lt

strap

Buy
Does (lips

insures

circus

'6"

O2" IW Includesrake, fa - BuTTor
iSSTj

'
An2r,ong I '" LrTSHWimILHNAUro9 j
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fcS

Liquid

OP)

WesternAuto Batteries...power
choice of 41 mJWon

vahie-mind-ed motorists !

(or carsup
Forquick,sure

Side

Vmttrml

-

!"
"T08 w to ca' J dwoedwng tte tat90 Oyi t repUctd lrt AIM B perod ml

H? " W I ("!Pbsot or tatltna u n cOTimcra um rt wrroM loc htf c De" eonen.or ooer prtj or tanritic& ten teen
m.wMiMii wkr Kinxaj ccnscaxdsiy ncscniMffo More

TT
- a--

59 GMMte l

UtecitSfMi

Turtle Wax

1207--

21

Reg.
1.19

over

or

Reliable startingpower
455

starts.
TerminalType 31.99

5.

12
48

With

W) SOP)

38.95

Auto
BiStnesralii

n?30

nuHHiMMf

Uaholsterv tVav

?''m uz.

ami Hun sh j " x inr nr ' ' r - r ' '
"'v, t jt v .'

SAVE

Cleaner

89Buyi

14 oz Save now'

to C.I.D

1111 xx
iT

Regular
5.29

SAVE NOW!
Chamois

Top-quali-ty full
skin ZVz sq.ft.

new--

8I3P)

Use
SAVE Your

Credit!

886

Volt
Charger

Battery
48 Month

mm
Value!

Western Limited Battery Warranty
"ST"!!?mi"if??Lar

S'JSIILKSlliTii??' duwi mortl!!lenphrtownhp.IKteantetxt&ixtBtar&utiqptt
""""f"10". traztnvtiMansifcreddtlK--

fleyoart.69

pOlpf'ijvfV'

krf

Chrome Remover

Li
L&

Oil-Tann- ed

Save

CREDIT!

Warranty!

Regular

Iw-s-
L Mi

3

Regular- -

$nRiruc5a'K$

SAVE 26c NOW!
Polish Cleaner Ralfv Croam

mv
30c

Top Wax!

Jm&

Vafuef

1.30

Handy.

t.99
Value

SAVE 80c NOW!
Rim CleaningBrush

(or while- - afl-l- fl

walls, wire rims Ifor wheels.Tough!
B(3P)

SAVE 6.96! Standard12 Volt
with 24 Month Warranty!

LlWflselpriBtdcrb-f'jwyjf- t
WmI tor wi

.

knfcMr

7A
12V with 60 Month Warranto!-

i.- - .
' Ourjnestpowerful! Has j

plenty storting, pow--
- erfer Vs with engines

BuoTar

WLHB Save!

l"HHCv-7QC?OO-C 133

Vinyl

u -
--VVf

now)

Ideal

tmsso--

Aw Mm mi hmm

w
--j'jt.

ef

up (J.I.D.

7J7221

rdii ffvPWW

' 86(34

V "TaTi - .a, '" ? '. (yi ii

3P)

Piilow-Pa- k

CarWashWax
Regular10cBach

18f

36

For

25
So convenient Each pack has
enough washwax for averagecar.

- i



I OK unci
BtnteMt

i

SVVJB
Fielder's i$$Glove Only..

Better Now Our Best Glove

Kit i
(

i Regular
VUOTIIIUO, 888

w:

Regular
14.99 1299

laces ) Genuine 1(C)

! Glove OU 88c

70 Wool Felt
BaseballCap

Reg.
2J39
Buy 177

6S(C)

me-
dium, large Navy

Wf WDC I" tWUMU) j .w J

r y Reg-- 5

O Balls Only M 9 Psig)
Choosewhite or yellow balls.

Softball in redwhite,
blue white or gold
white 1.69

NOWl

Glove

9.99
tail 155.

t&UiR rawhide
steerhide fielder'stype

In

Tennis
MIC)

Regular7.49 Has vinyl outer
shell with leatherwelt Raw-
hide lacing A great buy'
City League Baseball

89c

im I! 'xA

Little League
Approved

Baseball...

1
OUTDOOR FUN FOR THE ENTIRE FAMILY JUST SAY,"CHARGE

"i"i"Mirv

White TennisHat...
Comesin S. M.
L and za sweatband.

Regular1.95

Reg.
t.99
Buy
Cork
core,vinyl cover

Regular

Adjustable
Visor

1
White cotton, fits all.

2.65
Value

XL Has

Sun

29

77

(A)

(B)

(C)

jSc ' S j

:rJZ: )

(A) Little LeagueApprovedBaseballBatDurable white
ash. Assortedlengths. 3.49

(B) 1 Pc.Aluminum Softball or Little LeagueApproved
BaseballBatsHave aluminum knobs andtapedhandles.
Assorted lengths. 7.77

(C) Revelation JuniorBaseballBat Durable white ash
construction 26 in. long. Ideal for beginningbaseball
players. 1.77

IT"!

rfr SAVE i
SAVE 1.11 Jr

5 PcTennis Set
Regular9.99 Value Regular6.99!88

Tennis Racket

Completewith lami-- Has laminated
nated racket three H frame, rein-tenn- is

balls, cover k X forced throat.
5 Pc. Pro-S- et 36-25-1 11.88 Press .

Y vJLp,ayground save2.oo J !iP?v
SN A A Badmintonand Quality Multi-Pl- y Reg. Jr

Colorful
redblue

finish!

599

volleyball Set Basketball Onl- y- "19 BadmintonSet 4J"ST 1199 eguf-r5.- 29 440(flc(aI sjM f0r 2 Players I oo--

fleg. j.49 Every-- no andweiaht W uigi 9IC

.. L. thing neededto playi Tan or redwhite & blue A Set 4.99 I



HI PHfejSSAVE1.96NOW! I' ''((ilHlH W
.' WoodenAuto Creeper I sMrS&i''fflKr&m I
Kl Xxji"JH RegularKJ9SYatut HAA fl ,ggi."Mi i'SfcM 1 ,

IffbaMk
Kkhild(r

19
LaVjaaaaaaaaaaaav

gar-- nyioncastorsanapad-- rgg i Jpf ,Sl'lWWy I f JJfBBarPaar" E2JL
ded headrest 37 L I'M tum. U IMJtABBSH-lHiBl- B ann tim BbVbC,'

Defcixe Creeper &99 ? ow N HHQHHliSQ "' HII WtjMjrDO-rT-YOURSEL- f K
SAVE 3.50

QKty1Ton
HydrauWc

Axle Jack

14
fleeterJ49
Lifts from 7 to
14 In. H. Re-
liable strength)
3 Ton

Jaaaaaaaaaaaaaf--

4(A) , 19.99

BT

Charge
It!

jataaaaaaaaf H V aV

daaaaaaMaaaaaW
jmaaaaaaA' aaaaaaaaEibk

aaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaa
fc ,jBfBYBPaBBBaaBaaaBvKk

tBaaa&BavBa

I attfcSaP'r zirASfiLarJaaaaW1! -

I I Tw'vaaaH
l I aaaaa?

H

SAVE
Motorcycle

Safety Helmet

34(C)

Add It To
YourAccount

Durable construction!
Dazzling white comes
in of 2 sizes.
Red or Blue Cycle Helmet

..1659

- VaV
' K ."S&5

i

I

SAVE 2.96
Motorcycle
12V Battery

W)

175

your

Reenter2295
Reliable for
many popularmodels.
More Powerful Battery

-- 23.99
Most Powerful Battery

-- 269

SAVE 74c
DeraM2TM

JecK stewi

Vmktat

Lexan"
helmet

choice

Kiteef
power

w
Adjust from
13V4 to 17V in.
high. Durable
steelconstruc-
tion. Savenow!

Add It .

To Your
Account!

'.aaVaW'IBBaaB

2 or 4 Stroke j

Cycle Oil

lor Qt

SAVE

66c

Motorcycle Brake
and Clutch
Reg. 2.95

Fit all
Pr

JE. Hr VAWfTOYOW Ml6H96 OPF CflAKEACCSUNT! H

laavv

9008- -
1 (9

PortableDrive-O-n SteelRamps
atOurAnniversarySalePrice!
Regular26.95 Value Row
Ideal for under-the-c- ar mainte-
nance' Rugged enameled,die-form- ed

steel.Supportsto5,000lbs.
DeluxeRamps 25.S9
StationaryStepStandfor Ramps

Regular
mostcycles'

Levers

Hondas!

29

Only..

Seeinset) . 5.44

WIDE SELECTION OFMOTORCYi

mm
1.15

W&VV.

Save Needs!
CarbCleaner 1.29
Chain Lube 1.19
Degreaser78-6920-9(2- 1.29

9Mp

Folding Aluminum
Foot RestPegs

Reg.4.95 AQQ
Fit most

bikes! Pr

Fast-Actio- n

Ma,Lh'"9

Mi

Motorcycle

flDHK'B aaaaatt
BBBB1 VTBbTBbTB

IwJjj
13 F NFFflxI

w (B
--wv gf K

Naaaf VI
I laaaF V

on
(A)
(B)
(C)

SAVEL cxvifo
c 51 r

Throttle
Reg. 5.49 MAQ

)7
5(Q gnp. Save'

aaYAaat
IBBBailBBBl TBbTBbTBK

'
S. ft

!

SparkPlug
Quality
Champion
brand'

W

Cycle

SAVE 1.50

Motorcycle Tie
Down Hooks

Reg.6.49
fnr niUun

3(C) trailer use'
I99



polyes-
terSAVE insulation

zipper.

.29 Ground
4rx7'L44--

'Regular

Value!

44--

I.SC)

Has 3 Ifca of
100

in. long
Big Cloth

14.95

k5899-8(8G)1.-

jJI 27x72 In. Air Mattress
&tS&WtEEukmBi Laminatedvinyl fl JIA

1

fr

p V

3
1.35

& save!
3 BaHs

BS

Ft. Screen
. Your Account!

to
for

is flame-retarda-

andmildew-resista-nt for
Lets in air. out

JUj On art It feaai aw

49
'SMBlLHEHiv Reg.1.95 JBrfifc .faliLi

- CM. TfTTtirn .in Imr t iinTniihlMMiiriu SAVE - . .
v 'anSSSK5Sfcj' Ifcri CampStool j

jBL "K-- a CTvmlirff- -
m

C8G) '

LSH" "A5K)0ii(r-- a CampChair44-- KJB
- u7TZZl ' ,. 7006-8(8- 4.39 ""

J
YUUR SAVE THESE S!

"Tft 1 u.a ' I M 1 1 1 1 1 M "J 1
"MHpPMTrr

s

, SAVE 36cNOW!
Packof Golf Balls

Regular Vabie

Stock-u-p

Deluxe 99

smbhhii lever action.What funi
nHMWH
ijiBajBs.

c ;frs-- -

It. .
Regular69.95 Value Ready assemble!

Ideal camping,backyard
Rugged plastic water

long service
fresh keeps insects

Wootom-rty-le

SAVE 19.96NOW! 12x12
Add

entertaining

tense raliXt fbtdartu c

fflLaBlBttlcM-

! 66C

amirt I iH
BM1 Vsliffi1

Authentic

To

. - - awa

DaisyBBRHI

2.50
4 Steel

Steel horseshoes
are designed for 7S

plav. aW "
Set With Stakes 139

mri .

Choose bright
color

8G)

4.96
Dining Canopy

9Q99
TmUi 8SG)

Ruggedcanopywith
tear,mildew-resista-nt

plasticconstruction.
Washescleanwith gar-
denhose.12x12 ft

SAVE 1.80

14IrotaB.
89G)

Reg. Buy
Fluorescent
type.Ruggedl

USE CREDIT ACCOUNT AND ON SPECTfl!

.KsacrdF

House

SSSjl! J M I J 1 1 J wi aj
b i irr hi tW JT mj 1 1 n 4 1

1C99 El
SAVE NOW!

Horseshoe

U(f0

99
SAVE

fleguar34J5Vaue

Lantern

99

SAVE 50c! Roll-U- p Hat
Regular2.19 Value Now
Ideal for fishing, golfing' 1 Dw
solid

print or

15.79

i ssirtj:r3.westcrmauto ' "



fte

S'J'

Ifc

HtWIWMM"'iM-T.6rtLMHtHwirtlllit- .

V

SAVE 7.96 NOW! 20 In. Moto Cross
Style Bike... Put It On Your
Regular77.95 Value Now Only...

Classy black satin-fini- sh with moto cross
style handlebarsand paddedsaddle
Realistic-lookin-g racing numberplaque
Reflector systemfor safernighttimeriding
Knobby lread tires on front and rear

fcC? at 24

AUTO 30

Duraflex Model
21.99

f-c- -

Lsuaa
USE YOUR CREOIT!

rjfemn nfvahirl

In

v:

if N

IV

-- rfS-

'

Popular
Account!

hi una
32792- -

9(20

OHVC o.3o:
Big 24 In. Skateboard

colors! 12

3

99
Regular19.95 Buy

.Rugged1' 2 in wide
Polyethylene
construction

ru Men'sor Ladies'
26 In. Touring Bike

ShimanoDerailleur 0 0 Cgearsystemwith twist fl""J5v5)
grip control for quick mMfJfand easyshifting !!Baked enamelfinish wsn

with chromed trim
Paddedsaddle.BMA6 approvedreflectors

24 in. 10--
" dt

!RacMV:.Add'
to Your ChargeAccount!
Regular93.95Value'

HasShimanoEagle
Derailleur gearsys-
tem andside-pu-ll

handcaliperbrakes.
89
t

fltl

99
Incjrton

5(2f)

Orangeenameledfinish wchromed trim. Han-

dlebarsaretaped, plugged.Reflector system.

I



-

Add this
Your Account!

Lightweight 2-Sp- eed

Bectric TroHngMotor
ForSmallBoats& Canoes!

Powerful 10ampmotoradapts
to troll or stop-- hold -- drift -a-

nd-go' 360 pivotal steering

Trolling Motor
58.88

Battery CaseDurable plasticconstruction

"fX
Easy to
inflate
oids up

compacUyl

to

H.

MWXcatmuMaftk
tend i lnn i tt a
teal Ci c
itfttiflM. TUskn tfvfjs
ktMaryaqr

Reg.
24.95

dk

0099

.4
68t(-

0.2C)

SAVE 4.96 NOW
Inflatable an Boat

1999
Rugged 78" long
vinyl boatwith
3 air compart-
ments Repair kit

32.99
Foot Pump

5.99
Pr. 45'Oars

5.99

UrfStmtotm
stocfc Is eiKtJv
mllMi Iron
sor Btsrty
fltstrttBtm ctdtf

SAVE

14.96

JT

Durable nylon cover, Kapok-fille- d

Adult size.
Child's 339
Youth's 4,49

Our5.5H.P.
OutboardMotor

25999
1(X

Reg.274.95 qutotiy to 11 mph!
Featuresa quiet undor-wate-r mutller twist-gri- p

control and 360 steering forward
and full pivot reverse With

Weighs only 39 lbs Buy now
7.5 H.P. Motor 319.99
9.9 Motor 37-6-6 569.99

o Aire .

nman

Regular 5.99

Orange.
.

37--4 117-0(2-

Vaue-Tro- lls

Has

H.P.

5L,OUTDO"0
I MOTOIJO"- I

BoatCushion
49

Regular
7.79

Coast
Guard

approved

Qt Outboard
Motor Oi- l-

88!37 5066- -
eiJG)

Reg.1.09 Value
SAE 30 weight

mm um ipr Autoloaderw4X Scope Al- -- J) JSCBfcii5S3TT""S?
--Hi! SsSsSW Fires lon9 n,,es ITIMQ 'var ? n TjJMTTtin "i5

! 1GB5' fastasyou canpull the trigger' MUSO 5S5ff L)
W Sportingsight, walnut-f.ms- h stock jjq)' uJ-W'k- ? B&SSSSF33

H SjJUJlsiS"' fleguarto 44.95 StrongBeamed jWiL!5?ZH)
H B OutdoorLantern 111 1Z!nrIB JMWnrs ChooseBolt Action Single

Shot.22ode.orYosode. JS.-f- 9 ''AVE 3rflwBP arrel Youth's has18". flfc JDQ ststant inn I.ES WMh4XScoBB38.2Q05.06w piast.c .22 Long Rifle UUM
?3B 5130(4G) 41.99 PTPJ-- Uses2 D' ceiibatts Cartridges Now mMmM
rjt WESTEHM AUTO 12 SS.Z'JZrZ "X-i- .- ---T



WesternFlyer Bikes...chosen
by more than11 mUUon riders!

Competition oranga
with chromedtrim

tnnrtlUW Suro-stoppi-

,TJ ,' ratOMMi. caliperbrakes
BMA6app. satety
reflectorsystem

Boy's or Girl's 20 In.
Buzz Bike with Denim Saddle

Blue with orangeover-spra- y enamellinish
chromed handlebars andfenders
Stylish "knobby-trea- d reartire
Approved reflectors andrearcoasterbrake
Boy's model alsohas handcaliperbrake
Girl smodel haspretty woven plasticbasket

TOM
Auto hasthebest

town' Yes. many Auto Wencante!l you In sec
onds the major item you want is
stockandwhen you canexpectto get it'

Af Sim ml hi oct Is
afcttf mliM trow Mr

ttaUmVc enter. V -

.- - .

'

- 'i

Him r

tBi3fiH9Wkv

---gtn SM. 'nCT-.--Br-- J 4

hand

front SI t.r "
WJ7 av , w ; .hw Tfw'X D JKT f ll .11 W " "

NEW Western Catalog orderingsystem In

pfipp Western
il merchandise in

SERVICE!

Ever-Popul- ar Marx
Big Wheel" Cycle

88
Low-slun- g styling for ex
tra stabilityl Steel hand
brakefor rearwheel con-
trol Built-i- n saddlebagl

WhatFun! Roaring
"Hot Cycle"

Regular19.95Value!
Soundslike a racer! Has
sturdy plastic
body, low-slun- g frame
with adjustableseat.

Girl's 24 In. Model
66.99

Regular5.49 Valve!
Handsome satinblack. Save'

V I I

10.79

cut
L

Value!
3 flat

up to
17 nut sizes-- Handy!

rt amo

"JcwriMmMT

Red.whfte and blue
enamelfinish and

saddle
Safety reflectors
andcoasterbrake

erGirl's
26 In.

nn99f 3L 69
wSrtrJJTli

18

1C99

Enamel finish, chromed
Coasterbrake.

niB "taurtM

Regular

Value!

--7Rf)

trim.

Safety edgeswon't
little fingers! 24Y4

3-P- c. Tool Ktt
Aeg. 1M

wrenches

Moto
Cross

Handfebars

BuzzMte

matching

Bey's
Bicycle

SAVE 1.91
WesternFlyerWagon

888

SAVE 31cNOW!
Bicycle

99

444
Lra.LWESTTH AUTO 29J



HaroldEnstey w
r- -r TheSportsman's

Friend fyf r 3d flKS 101 -- Pc. Spin Cast Combo
Zebcoouttit in 4QS9
ctuaesroa reel'

Ww

KLa

Steel
A

8 compartment
Rust-re- -

i

ffjgl I-ff-
J "

Saveon Fishing Equipment Now...Charge It!

(A) SAVE 2.96! Harold Ensley6ft FL Ught Action SpinRod . . . 19.99
(B) Harold Ensiey5 Ft Youth SpinCastRod 9.95
(C) SAVE 2.96! Harold Ensley6 FL BassCastingRod 79-1- 0 . . 19.99
(D) Harold Ensley5 FL Ultra Light Spin Rod 16.99
(E) Garcia 300 SpinningReelwith Drag .

- 22.95
(F) Garcia Mitchell Abu-Mat- lc 170 SplncastReel .... 29.95
(G) GarciaAmbassadeur5000 Bait CastingReel 39.95
(H) Garcia Mitchell 206 FreshwaterSpinningReel 14.49
(J) GarciaMitchell 308 Ultra Ught SpinningReel V) 27.95

sMthdeT jl ill
m lilillln)r, fW J ma

(Q) SAVE 1.50 L1211 Ught Spinning Com-

bo Reg. 11.49 5H tt. rod 9.99
(R) SAVE 96c Zebco1545 Spin CastCombo Reg 11.95

5 ft. tubularglassrod 10.99
(S) SAVE 250 Johnson088 Spin CastCombo Reg. 13.49
5ft It solid glassrod 10.99
(T) SAVE 3.96 True Temper"Fishing Machine" Ultra
LL Spin Combo Reg.3f.95 5ft tt rod 79-1- 44 27.99

GO F1SHIN...USEYOUR CREDIT!

Tackle Box
Regular5.59

KWtray
sistantfinish

Mitchell Teflon

Zebco Action

Q

I 'SitmTtkWi

SpinnerBait Box
Has55 lure
capacity So
convenient1
Buy onenow 4

(U) SAVE 2.96 Oaiwa Ultra Ught Mini CastCombo Reg.
32.95 4ft tt rod 29.99
(V) SAVE 1.96 Revelation7 FL TubularGlassSpinning
Rod Reg.9.95 Speciecork grip . 7.99
(W) SAVE 1.00 RevelationTelescoping FiberglassSpin
Rod Reg.9.99 27 in to 6 It long . 8.99
(X) SAVE 2.50 TrueTemper6 FL Solid GlassSpin Cast
Rod Reg.1Z49 Cork grip . . . 9.99

49
9(V)

18" BassNet
8" alu- -

MhlM
handle a

(K) Reg.31.95!
CastReelOnly
90yds of line

.JI79.1S5- -

ZebcoSpin

29"
(L) Reg. 4.19! Revelation
Spin CastReel
With innvrlc nllinA 3!
(M) RevelationCenturyReel
With convenient 9
(N) Zebco Spin Cast Reel
Has heavyaction If
(P) Reg. 4.79! Johnson
'Skipper" Reel
240 ft of line

V)

v am ommw

w? wm.v ---

4f t ','' Heguiar AmmtfffmWjW
minnm Br 8.79 KAXAWP

Reg. value! jJSry
5tv) x VH!

3!

Minnow Bucket jfeCXj SAVE 2.13teiaa i49tli M SpinCastCombo
WE,i 8 qt ggT1r 5 " soi,d Aim eellJESfl V Dip Net I , glassrod M'BQWJ sfck nnr s r!?lw!,.h9i HIIIbMjP -- V Uv " yds. line' jp w, 159500

JS."u. WESTERNAUTO 13 f



x Held
"" CacuatorFor...

SAVE 88c! Bike Pedals HandlebarGrips'.f9M Regular2,65 Value '9 MM Regular79c Value f fl rf
' Mm VAmKar rof lartnrenn H Molocrossstyle

Reg.8.95
What fun"

sur ii Imlafl

Texas
It adds, subtracts,
divides, figures

Calculator with
Memory 229

Adapter 4.99

JUST CHARGE IT!

ffc Mickey
PpL Mouse
TTk. Pocketft .A wtch

JJlMBtiflr

ConvenientHand

iDniun

Instruments!
multiplies,

percentages)

I yjlHrTBt LrMt
ConvenientCredit I

r.i

7(11)

By

AC

82
88 character keyboard
with automatic-- spase
tabulator. Variable line
pacerandHuedrawing

apertwrel

SAVE 50c
Bic

Butane

Reg.0
149vv
Thousands of lights
with just a flick
of your Bic' Save"

wide keys jf"

WesternAuto hasPet Supplies... 'em Your Account!
(A) Durable FL orCat Chain
(B) or Cat Dish

FL Dog LeadChain
PopularRawhide Pkg of

(E)A FL Dog LeadAssorted colors
WESTBRM AUTO 28 lij.4 Mm '

milUd IDIIUblUiaUII
sides In3ses' I Jwsse-- Buy now save'

wn V
99HeV. kmnnnt f EaSV-TO-U-se

5

-'Ja

. a Bicycle K"
t. TubeSealer

999) VbTb

SAVE 1 .55 Bike Saddle ?"'" ?? RHlI
AL innertubesand Palrj57, equip- - lLJfeadj

'"" ,
2(F) ment easily' j,.

I fieguar15.95

99 iTrw iSS'" I

Popular
Lighter

KJbt
9EJ39rII

2.96 l 1
bicycie I

r Carrier

1999i I
ZDuioiigmwitn acw .. 1 ; I
horn switch' n II. fl I

I ' llP- - iSSf ' 'OL.

I SAVE SAVE 86c NOW: I
1 Floral-Desia- n Bike Basket 36 In. Bicvcle ChainLockI

. &&5k i flegufar2.95 Value aflCMI Reg"'a''2.85Vaue aQQ
l lKL 1 Rugged woven vv Plastic-covere- d steel' 193 1

"fti Vati9fc I Plastic 13 in 7 Comeswith 2 1fi Add to
10 Dog Tie-O- ut

Dog Double Bowl Feeding
(C) Rugged4
(D) Rolls 1066-5170-7(-

Leather

V

athletic

i

Remote JJ

f

96cNOW!

i Day-Gl- o Bike Banner Bike Speedometer 1

79c i Regular7.85Vaue aAQ Regular7.95Vaue TQQ 9
1 6." 2Cn"ber' . iSS Forall bikes' Re-- Jl i

49c glass Buy l33," cordsup to 40 mph' V 1
1.19 J



DGallon Bottle
Freeze water to
cool tee chest.
Locks into topot
ice chesteasily.

89c

"

Ice
Reg.

sT

"Tote 12".lceChest
Regular7.99

poly-
ethylene with r
urethane insula-
tion Holds 12 cans
plus
redwhite combo

Mm
nooflvfl BfS2ttfr

Regular1X99
Easy to fold &

Has tube steel
legs,chromed

urgn

Charcoal
Lighter
Fluid...

Regular 9.99 Buy
2 grids, air vents &

10x17"

f
I iHLIrW 9 SflL v

SAVE 3.00
Portable

24"Brazfor

10
PopularHibachiGrill

tr

8
Charcoal

OJ000--

Regular

11 IEPBPgW fleguiar95c
31 Fast starting
(IB HjBPfeS Qt. size can .V PB P b.

99
76G)

Briquets

159
1.8S

kMl( VHfefKSf HHP VBP
Easyto
start
In

J

j 30 Quart Ice Gallon Jug
JJQA Top-mou- nt LfjHpour

SSffls8 ii531?B2 Gal.
spou&

Jug
handle
Spigot ft 49

44.13M.
faeQaHfeoflox value! hPh

liner .ieC) B 3G a ,JaEMSB. LUoi Q.

2imd 1 1 3 H 1 1 1 1 1 n n 1 8jSf. ' ' sigpjwB5MjBMMM omoKer... h

-- 'ti lllELLILLLv I catcher .4jfe IBSSlJz' iec," al
fltfi 9K& T" ' H . . Givesmeat H HVS jm i disposal!

& Gallon PlasticJug I X? JSS'IS9 fpf

fleouarZ99 m . oAVC H aVM

Foam Chest
7.59 VaJue-- 30 qt

Side molded handles.
Durable tmhl-litli- rt

hi WESTERN tUTO 14 SS
I rraaaBBB

-

Value

ice Colorful

V
24 in. R

15.99

carry 1

tripod

2Shigri.

M.

adjustment

86G

Wlb.
bag

Chest Steel
fleg.T4.49 flJA

1

Handles.

1 "

91

4
Foam eavy gaugesteelwithinsulated. JAM M 1 m tubular steel HQ polyethylene W9 W DHb legs

1 3 aT "'5- - "im A and wide wheels. Heat
. Gl C " I SBBSSL W con.ro. with adjustable '

W J spiqo, 4.49
upperand lower drafts, f J

SBSBH2HejBBV8HBJBVjHBjHflBBBBHff?ij3H

"MfeBaHBvaVHHVH '9



1

.

SAVE 5.70!Deluxe
StandMixer.

Reg.20.69 Vaue
With featureslike:

settings
for versatile
food mixing'

nfaSBi nB35 !HBHk

Detach stand, mixer becomesportable'
Automatic bowl rotation. 3 ot bowii
Pushbuttonbeaterejector easyclean'

YOUR PURCHASES-A-DD 'EM
"ffC 5p ft

E5"
QuartCookerFryer

Heg.iB.95Buy
Bake,boil. stew. 13even pop cornI

QL Cold PackCanner
Regular8.49 Vaue Qn
Porcelain-cla- d steel 6with wire jar rack

vV- -. L.! ,w ew H i

MfP

2J

5

Jt

20

Reg. 17.95Buy
Thermostatcon-
trols for toast

i

SAVE 6.00!7Pc."Harvest"Cookware
--Add it to your CreditAccounttoday!
Regular32.99Value,Now Ont- y-

Set includes 1 & 2 qt sauce-
pans. 5 qt. Dutch Oven and
1 0 in. trypan plus3 lids
Black heat-resista-nt handles'

Wml

Featureseven-heatin-g, porcelain-cla-d aluminum ex-
teriorswith g. II interiors!
Warmly decorated'Harvest" pattern on each piece'

At Ma startIt miiMt Warn mataMMai cnttr.

GROUP TO YOUR

atb MhJv t

m
with

VhI

in. J
2- j

Reg. 2.99 Set of 8. QQ
8 Pint Canning Jars ww

45-P- c. Set
Reg. 47.95Vaue QQ

"Colonial af .ww

SAVE9.9!Mr.Coffe

HmbbbHbbbbbbH MiSEHkCEpSiSI' tWSSCTi'

PastryToaster Ironstone

CharmingrfO U

JarsWith Lids

Heritage" pattern.

Brews

Teflon

A

sfoSSMCMaaaaHfl SiYisJLYJBEPflMkwaafaStwBsaatYaM

aYaYaMBtYaYaYaYai iH liYJiHBtwaaaHBMusStvaY&'aWarSs
ILLaaflLLLLLH KSHElHMe9B9HI

Canning

T
Ring & Lid Set

Regular99c Value
Pkg of 12 Be sure

1.79 you have enough

UseYour Credit!

asm? PrMI

Canning

79'

Disposable paper filter traps
bittersediments flavor stays
fresh' Built-i- n warmer'

331

iBm

50-P- c. StainlessFlatware
Reg. 39.95Value ftg
Pewter-loo-k 991,',; pistol-gri- p knives. WmrnM

HI

SupermaxHair StyterDryer
Reg. 2435Vakie
Two heatsettings23'& 5 attachments.

I AUTO 27

I



SAVE 3.50on RedwoodAluminumChair
Regular14.49Value Contouredseatand
back ot genuine stained redwoodslats

gleamingaluminum frame
Built to last (or years 23x32 in high
ChaiseLounge 21.99
ComfortableRocker 13.99
Settee 21.99 ServingCart 9.99

ExV7 Enoy mH'Wfijm
HEtt rifflf the savings Wj'frAJ

iRvMvBflS--- ' : useconvenient m 5& Tj
--' rWlP crcd,t! flt3

HfcistaiEBSB- - --AMI

SAVE 2.22 NOW! Web & Aluminum Lawn Chair
Regular plasticarms Built sturdy!

Rocker 11.99 Chaise 13.99
Plastic Patio Table 18x18x16' ... 4.99

hb .i w m ii' in

26.95

SAVEMiKl
UYotflCri3

In r yi f ii RftJytAA

Metric SetOnty

I

QS)

TWW PPIVnWJ
5ft tabic nd
2hfotMt.Wrth
brwid tegsand
9rT09nv9&QQ6S

SAVE 4.96
5 Ft. Oak Porch Swing

Reg.
199

weainer-- m m s?-a-a

resistant Bh D

clearvarnish finish'

Get
several&

charge'em!

f"efi&
Folding Lawn Chair

Reg. 6.69 Vaue
Has toughplas-
tic webbingand
lightweight

frame Comesin
assorted colors

4.99 Buy
Solid statewith
5 Has
a 2ft in.

I

AM pocket-styl- e Radio
Regular

transistors.
speaker

49

fir Uii H

1

Ai Hta Ml la sfect U fktt, mdiUe.

teutons.

tSsKs'- - jJHjHj

BffB
KM ChargeIt!

'

It. nn Uk""

Reg.14.95
Solid state,
9 transistor.

Reg.
34.95

I
v

VI

Umbrella

(3J4.49

Deluxe FMAM Radio

Wearphone

AM Clock Radio

Digital aaTa
withO-E- O HIV 4

minute sleepcontrol

FMAMMPX Radio
Reg.
69.95

Solid
state

;

lets too.

9ID1

MT

3(D)

Features built-i- n AFC for
drift-fre- e reception Twin
4 in. speakers separate
tuning controls.

LrtrTwgremAurrJi5"



hS

Groupyour purchases
.add 'em to your account!

USE YOUR ACCOUNT NOW!
", WoodHnfeh

i
3, 3, 4"

Brushes..

Primes, seals&

finishes! Quart

RustNaught
EnamelPaint

2MS-

Tin
Reg. 249! ss

PL can.

IMMil
" Regular

.

nNOW!
Homestead

Exterior
Latex Paint
For Only...

Mfl En

Regular5.49 Value
Rowson smoothly
with eitherbrush
or paint roller!
Bright white finish
withstandsweather-sta- ys

brilliant)
Soap,waterclean-up-!
Coversup to 350 ;

ft pergallon!.

&

sm 099

179

Mrro26issnr;

RoHerFrame
Reg.2.19 CO

Uses9 1u9
rollers.

8" RoHer Cover
for Only...

Reg

4

Reg.
139
Buy

149
72S59J--
8P)

Dynel. For
mostpaint

Latex Caulking
Cartridge

89
Seals tightly In
11 oz cartridge.
Caulking Gun 72--

I1595-7(2P-

)

handyf

1.49

C
Reg.45c
Steel with

Latex HousePaint
Reg. 10.49 Buy Tf ftfl
all outside .

Tough

In 6
colors!

wood handle.

2

lb. 9

tm JV--r

Paint
Remover
Quart can

1

t"
finish. Gal.

SAVE
1.00

HI-Te-

Spray Paint

Regular3.19

For engines,
barbequesand
heaters!With-

standsup to
1000 F 13oz.

PuttyKnife

9C

C(2P

Fine Quality
Sandpaper

1P29

19

C

Packageof
6 sheets.

3-- J$L Buy

W - Jfc Safe

ftfP use!

199I
72P)

39P)

r

Latex Interior Paint
Reg.8.79

isoiouasia ea.2200--

washable.12 39C)

beautiful colors. Gallon.

8

I
In 5

colors!

USE

Regular
17.95

Sanded
select
pine!

5

70c
Spray

Paint Now

1

99

SAVE

Epoxy

39
Regular2.09

Dries hardto
porcelain-lik-e

finish. For ap
pliances.Comes
in 13 oz. spray.

CHARGE FIX-U- P

QQC

s a t

YOUR t
CREDIT! If

SAVE 5.96 w

5 Ft. Wood Stepladder

1199
8(2P)

Metal reinforced steps, risers.
Side lock and pail shelf Folds



KE7C00L&
COMFORTABLE--

CONVBnMT
CREMT

AVMUBLE!

connects

Sealed

f OBHBMIIHbb IHbIbHbbbbbbVIIBV IbbbbbbbbB
' j
' bMUbbP'

SAVE .96 NOW 5,000 BTU
6.1 EER Air Conditioner

Ideal for your bedroom!
cooling or fan

only
els, permanent filter

Installs outside heat
Svstem CirmlAtvt

air' compressor

J

pan 189 iivn
.. n

19.9 8,666 BTU UnH Wrth EER and
CeeSng . 249.99

SAVE 19.98 16,866 BTU UnH with
7J EER. CeeHng 82-3- 4 339.99
SAVE 29.96 13,888 BTU UnH wWi
6.0 EER, CeeNne.82-3-4 349.99

' OmOMAI MftlM MftUl!

13,000BTU 9.5rar
Aip Conditioner

i&iSBBBBMBBBvKii

Regular
399.95 QCQ99wBmnWsB Valueml How...

U11U--

humidified

HM bbHbIbbmbI

Casement

Casement

vr

Rmtd

MfcarilfcBW&: .
to

ma mni Ho

9

air
en 6J
en

en

t i

SAVE 19.96on 9.2 EER 7,800 BTU
Air Conditioner Unit.

Reg. 299.95 Value Only
nign efficiency model
packed with features like
automatic thermostat
power exhaust

279
tight custom almostanysize Hurry save'
SAVE 29.96 10.000 BTU Unit with
SpeedCooling Reg.329.95 82-3- 1

n.uuubiu unit with EER and
Cooling Reg. 329.95 82-3- 1 319.99

IbbbbB
SbbH'

JTIEttY TOOfBI A CHMGE ACC4WT AT WEXT9W TH

Features cooling and fan only oporation
Air-tig- ht panelsfor perfectcustomfit

SAVE 28.96 on18.888BTU UnKwW,
Reenter38.96Vafee 82-3-1

SAVE 286on23.868 BTU Untt wW, EERCeehngResjr49.96 Vafa82-3123-5(2- 43499SAVE on2esBTU IMM wW, 7.B EER
Ceettflesniter546195 Vatoe82-3528-5(2- 52X99

according the Industry StMOwtf UnK si in. km

"--

Is 99
IIS VHI
J350
7i7Wl

panelsprovide an air- -
fit window
on K etc j

.1 299.99
w on 6.6

- Ill

MlUi-tP-
-

a
6.4 EER2-Spee-d

6 4 ed

1 9 4

lo u v.

in
7

'

Regular199.95Value!

SAVE NOW on 6.4 EER
32,000 BTU Mobile Home
Air Conditioner Unit...

669

lust cut to lit

99
no voit
e. .

w

Regular699.95 Value!

NEW FREESERVICE!
Western Auto hasthe best
Catalog ordering systemin
town' Yes. many Western
Auto Men can tell you in
seconds it the maior mer-
chandise item you want is
iiy sck andwhen you can
expecttj jet '

SAVE 30cNOW!
Washable

Air ConditionerFilter
Reg. 99c Buy.'

Durable foam fil-

ter fits all 69
:



v-- .u. ryz s - rri JbbVvsbe Handy Staple
Sooth.ngmassagew4h every shower" Ad V , ill $mWL l"" fO Regular8.95 (BBM !! YflK;
lusts from I no spray to massageSave' A CW fr g Lotsof uses' 1 Q.Ui

IS JW iiZP Comesw.th t(W'MaflfcibAl j5r L, 1 BBS 1 ijkWZr wirescreen B W & H
117MRS: ir a , .W I m Z2&& attachment rdl u-w- B
UrS. jJBF Stationaryor j 1 H 4

uuK' stmpooi Bjjiuta?' MF hand-nefduse-.' r I

til IBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBB BBBBBMa "Kt- """"Ji hl B n " "V KSBBBBBBEBBBBBBBBBBBBX BH SSUBBBBP 9l

PopularFasteners
Regular 1.29

Choose assorted
screws,washers.
nuts and bolts or bradsand tacks

x "" Sqm
15 Ft.

fleg. 7.79 Value!

Medium-dut- y indoor
cord Oranqe 163

99

1
25 Ft Cord

mum 'pcs

C

Countless
around

house!

jFf

(A) SAVE 16c Slip Joint Nuts &

Washers 39c
(B) Stopper 29c
(C) SAVE 46c 42-P- c. Plumbing Re-

pair Kit 1.33

SAVE 20c on Nails
Regular79c
Your choiceof
40 60 80and 59
160commonnails Stock-u- p now'

uses
the Bujn

to last!

8(J)

v' n
ToughYale Padlock
Reg. 2.29Value!

Reliable security
for yourvaluable

1
2.99 items'With 2 keys Buy now'

Toilet Valve

fleg. 4.29
valve fits

mosttoilets Save' 3

ri9M r lfcr M tfV fBr BBJ
viivmriu BB BB1

H ' T 1

1HK)

c

afwM

Quality

Fillmaster

Pack of 2 Hooks
Reg. 1.45 Value

WiiuiUU1.v j V4nT
rassorantique 39h)

brass 2 hooks. 2 screwsperbag

1L . a A Bw w- r

Tank

Pin Night Latch

Reg. Value! Bat OA
bturdy steel

Attaches
easily Extra protection'Hurryr

45
With 24

5Vi cup

iz U

M M
7.39

Gun
TackerNow aLow

II H
HPU!
riiSotts

BEBBbI

ExtensionCord

'CT'--..BWi- -

Swag

119
StormDoor

Regular5.75 Buy

and
from 4 3H

slamming' one andsave"

V WWl ''-- l X.lUlffiklJ.vy HT

Ik

69

Tumbler

con-
struction.

2 Long Light Bulbs

'

Regular69c EfllBIBlC
w -U mo 60or XX) J0sscm

--it.
watt and save

'3JL rtBfBji BWBf w 1 - 1 jf I Bj I flM I J III flf Bj 9 M

Di finnaVf A- JjCWig 1 J 5Lj 1 I I I 11 1 1

. 9 aBBH I
BBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBB vSbbTJbVA I S

BBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBf &.BBBBBBBb!AV
BBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBVV ftW.BBBBBBBI vVW BjBBBBBBB

Jbt Plug Fuses0 JB
SAVE 56c NOW! Plunger

Reg.1.

in wooden
handle. in

Closer

Keepsstorm
screendoors

Buy today

ivr

Vaue.'

Choiceoltwo!

Life

BBB
BBB1

bulbs Stock-u- p

for

Value!

Your choice of B1-- AB"
k 1 tBW

1; 50 9 .to fl I I BBBfe

Mc amru3 I m
saLataSwwcctwauto2ir) M



ir

SAVE ON HOUSEWARE I1JMS flOW!
SAVE 6.96

f J I

d I

hSl I Regularmm T51 . J 22.95l, Nfc Vauei

' - -

SAVE 1.10
ChooseElectricor

Folding Table

c ,p

Wind-U- p Alarm Clock
Regular to 539 Twin-be- ll wind- -

up or illuminated electricclock

Durable
steel!

long

to

99

321J)

,hkv

4.96

steamvents'Has
convenienttem-
peratureguide.

A Regular

Value!

?"MWr jmW
SI 13 g5--

Ragular2S9.95Value
Now is tho timo to re-
placeyourold out-of-dat-

range w.th new
modern appliance at a
great low saleprice

Continuouscleaningoveneliminatesmessyovencleaning
9Vx In. high backguardhaselectric clock andmanual timer
Large10x18in. "seethrough" ovenwindow letsyoukeepan
eyeon whatyou're cookingwithout wastingcostlyheat

Any ten not it iisxx aguctiy
ivataae tram outaaafruaui ana

nr-Jg-s-,

71

2.29

"

mi ec .
,

a

N

Regular
26.95
Value!

SAVE NOW!
Iron

5J)

SAVE 40cNOW
SpongeMop

gajpw:)
SfiW--

189
Convenient built-i- n

wringer Save'

249
LIVE BETTER TODAY-U-SE

YOUR CHARGE ACCOUNT!

SpraySteamDry

21

rrB&. .J

1 '

Renter399.95
Allows foodsto
retain flav-

orful juicesfor
deliciousmeals!

30" Electric Range
with Self-Cleani- ng

Oven...ChargeIt!

00099
8283I6W)

Regular349.95Value!
"Minute Minder timer&
timed oven operation
for cookingease
White, avocado,harvestgold

'"'Iifc

"""

ConvenientCarousel
MiGrowaveOven...Add It
To Your AccountToday!

their 379
Automatic revolving tray cooksfoodstoons evenly
Food cook lajustYttie toneof conventional
ovens...kleal for working wAre, Busyhouxwives
Featuresconvenientautomaticdefrostcycle
Cooking Guide eliminatesall of theguesswork

ISSTU.'S.u.iWESTEBHAUTO 17



Decker rrmm706 - --.Ji n V In. Drill

Versatile
5 Gallon

WetEfy Vac

1199
WW

5Mn- -

OCX)

Rg.44.95Buy
ChargeMNow!

Ideal lor use in home
shop, garage even out-doo- rs'

Easily picks up
sawdust broken glass
even standingwater' Has
hoseandcompleteacces-
sories Enjoy rt now
add it to your account'

(PjW0k& kM

--
m

- Wm serfprojectsr vf easierandmore
P If comfortableto do!

J

""

Open-En-d ''fl'YQ I
WrenchSet I

WESnRNAUT024 QOWil MMM H4jt

AioiHtii II sHHT I

. aoamwatr U v I

r

Black & Decker
All-Purp- ose

Workmate8Only

XT ?& O099
"Br

its a (oldaway portable
work center giant vise
andsawhorse all in one'
Can besetupanywhe

garage. Handy'

SB3DPi && SAVE

fria Wfl I v5v

16 Oz. Claw Hammer
Heguar3-- Vaue 0 Mffk
Sturdy drop-forge- d " U
aici ctihi iiibfiuiy Jp 45C 3.

i . nanaie tavenow MB "

Why tiaitl Your Western
Ante ChargeAccount
earn help yen any Ms

m WBI Wf i

.

DriHs pi us,sands,polishes,buffs andgnnds,toof

Dsubtemutate! Has6 ft detachable I

Bteck It Deckwr
Sa-w-

AMU
toy
lamwf 15

DeubteInsulatedfor
safety, convenience!
Shoetatsto 45 for
bevef& mitercuts!

for
wood, for metal !

Ma4K4S-119&-4(2H)1- .9

SAVE 3.80! SocketSet
Regular1X79
SevenH'
sockets reversible
ratchetandcase

o
VU u

SAVE
1.50

5.99 Value
Featuresup to a' i

9

&
2BH)

lew

6(H)

Daubfeferer
clampholds

securely!

vV

10" Lock Grip Pliers
Regular

4

13

SabraJIg

99

49
ion gripping power -

Sturdv fomedsteel '"

99
ararj

cord

Buy
drive

Ehhe si" cHhV

LightweightTool Box
Regular2.99 Value gfl "flSturdy rust-resis- t- B Vantsteel Measures I 45J5&
11 in wide Handy' fl tn

il
Handy pocketsize!

SAVE
1.80

12' SteelTape Measure
Regular5.99 Value M t A
Top quality power B Jj
lock Sohandyfor &A 45532

rHI
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SMkJBfMi

12!utefngerafor7Frzer
Thinwall design for family-siz- e stor-
age a space-savin-g 28 in. width

door gasketsseal in cold
Perma-La-st interior is acid and
stain-resista- nt for long life
Durable white enameledextenor

WESTttAUTO18 tMMS I
WWW MAUttcmoMM

't

With 2 "

egg
racks!

Has
big slide-o- ut

crisper!

229
Regular Value!

WHY

WAIT?

YOUR

CREDIT

STAKE
IT HOME

TODAY!

NOW
SAVE

389.95
Value

Only...

59
Add this Your Account
15 Ft. Total Wo Frost
Refrigerator Freezer

Regular

DURING
SALE!

Cu.

3EjPllwp
Magneticdoor gasketssealin cold air. sealout heat
Separatecold controls for refrigeratorand freezer

slide-o-ut cnsper for vegetables,meats
Refrigeratorhas3 full width shelves
Perma-La-st interior is acid and stain-resista- nt

Left andright handreversibledoors for convenience
onuicu oiwnue,coppenone. gold
ice Kit .. 59.99

U .) nrjT?W.. ukj neingeraiors quality appliancespriced right!

in
Magnetic

th

239.95

USE

to

Full-wid- th

storage

avocado,harvest
Maker

"""B' t49Sy Hm door shelf
--Hi iTjPn FsVbV storage!

. 2--Hl f 5p Handy twin

1 ilLtfb 1
roUkitMi..

Side-By-Si- de RefrigeratorFreezer
Big 20.1 cu ft model features
total "No Frost" convenience
Space-savin-g thinwall insulation
unit only 31 in wide'
Acid and stain-resista- nt interior

Ice Maker Kit 59.99

46999
79330W)

Regular499.95 Value!
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1

S-4j-

11"1

USE

CONVENIENT

GRHJ

Handsome60 In. MediterraneanConsoleStereo.
Add It To Your AccountToday andSAVE 69.96!

FMAMFM MPX stereoreceiverwith built-i- n AFC MB M UOstereotapoplayer with manualautomaticselection F I BPThull-siz- e. BSR recordchangerwith "pausecontror
100 solid state"instant-o- n "performance
Handsomefurniture value, greatstereosound

SAVE 2.18NOW! Poputar
PortahtePhrmo Kama til" ...uiwry
esuiarl935Vahi 0)y...

Easy-to-us- e manualturntable
nas sappnire stylus. With 45
rpm adapter Durable yellow
and orangeplasticcase.

"1 W"

sI m

F MM

BBl ,jjrgbgufouror cost ExtendedWarranty on all electronics!

'UhIK bbIbI h I
'HbYbkbbbiBbbj Re9uiar bbbbhbbbI kv

.HBbVbBBBH 279-9-
0 BBBHBbS IH e; SAVE-- HB

H ComponentStereowith Cart...ChargeIt! I
JM FMAMFM stereoreceiver withbuilt-i- n player r j fi JJb JfcJj Irecord changerhasdiamond stylus, dustcover I HlHw VKH flPS Two 8 in two-wa- y speakersprovide greatsound I W Vl W H

P-- Walnut-grai- n finished carthassliding doors,casters I tvlwli5C!4,,,l
I I AddMional 8 In. Speakers Pr 15.99 Hlip' 'a0B

"r - -
SAVE cl BlankCa He

BBBBBBBBBBBn? MtkpMfr
V BBBWJ iwliliifiwr

29-9-5 mBBBBBBT Use
Kaue mF

SAVE 4J96!TapeRecorder
Lessensunit features
dependablesolid state
circuitry With micro-
phoneandblank tape.
Suy now charge it!

J
24

Your
Credit!

99
Uutatt.

NEW FREE SERVICE!
WesternAuto hasthebestCatalog orderingsys-
tem in town! Yes.many Western Auto Men can
tell you in secondsif themajor merchandiseitem
you want is in stock& when you canexpectit'

BBYH readdigital track B f

PPPPPread-ou-H BBBBV J fl

SAVE 9.96NOW! 8-Tr- ack

TapePlayerwith Speakers. . .
Add KTo Your ChargeAccount!
Resetter69.95Vaftre

Handsome tape player
with quality sound! Con-
trols for volume, bal-

anceand base.Jackfor 5999
364411- -

stereo headphones.Walnut-grai- n finished speakers.

ISSTUraJwUlBWMJTO 23
' 3J9HBf



Ft. ChestFreezer

Q09B

I !

tc Enjoy this Now! 1 !I0-
-

1F fk JH(B) yWHffilfllflQl I'Ml MlHillo-o- l

f Ml SmYf
M . Ml ImOM tE?"

' '
HI KV .J

m
costExtendedWarranty!

ml ' UnTfSS ,

W aj" " ' cSSaMWlWliK I lkB

;j iff ' sai&siESia i r.sHl
. ft ii ii hum ii mi t i rsHHunaw2E9Kr c i

'

-- US 'IBBIS''--C AlfCnal JP TWWW

& i 32.96NOW! I 4 :y
H ""kM""" 4 WaterHeateri 5r " .v

ra j QQ99f V --i
I I Regularto 132.9S :l
I oa I 40 gallon capacity. 1

I M I Choosdgas. LP gas jtg M''"B or electricmodel. ?J

I J - y

ChargeAccount!

91Q99

SAVE 19.96on Cu.
Upright FreezerNow Only

Reg. Buy
Holds up to 543
lbs 4 aluminum
shelves,slide-o- ut

drawer'

on

Reg.
wah wash--
ii ly lywtcra,
2 speeds(or
washinaflex

out wrinkles!

Add H to Your

Regular229.95 Value!
Big gallon porc&in
tub for washingac-

tion! 2 wrtngsrwith
handysafetyrctcaoo.

15 Ft

29935

279
SAVE 39.96

Use
Your Credit Now!

329.95
8

to Save

289
ibility. Big 20 capacity. Variable water
temperaturecontrolandwaterlevel selector.

SAVE 29.96 on Matching
Electric Dryer for...

Reg.239.95
20 lb. capa-
cityroom
to "fluff"

20
great

in.

5535W)

lb.

72.73I5W)

Automatic cycles for reg permanentpress.
SAVE! GasDryer 249.99

Over 2 million Citation Washers &

Dryers in America's households!

Wringr Washer..!

Imperial
Automatic Washer...

209

NEW FREE SERVICE! Western
Auto has thebestCatalog ordering
system in town. Many Western Auto
men can tell you in seconds if the
major item you want is in stockand
when you canexpectto get it'



B!':4F'

TMtlltlH

SAVE 9.96 on 23 Channel
CB BaseStation Unit...
UseConvenientCredit!

4 watt power Fea-
turesdeltafine tun-
ing to pin-poi- nt er

signalsand
variable squelch.

V' I

189

sJKKttmmmw.

CB Base
Station
Antenna

18
1(30)

Regular1935
9 ft long with
3V4 in wave

Save now'

iMwo22gsnrtr

99

Economy

88

Big 19 in.
Bookshelf
Console
ColorTV

49999
400)

Regular519.95Value!

Handsome television is
loaded with featuresyou
would expectto seeonly
In bigger,moreexpensive
consolemodels.Justlook
at whatyou get...

?2S29--

Automatic color puri-
fier for brilliant color

Handsomepecan-finishe-d

decoratorbookshe-

lf-style cabinetry
with roll-abo- ut casters

"Click-in- " UHF & VHF

Dependable Truetone
TVs over 3 million
sold bringing the best
in entertainment to
America's households!

JUrfeMMtlaitalbvwKr
mm won mi urawTTrni

700 Solid State19" Color
PortableTV... Use Your

Account To Buy It Nov at
This Low SafePrice & Save!
Regular
429.95
Vahio mmm9

Only...

Lightweight cabinet (or easymovement
sound

Has convenientone-butt- automatic(me tuning
Convenient "Click-in- " UHF andVHF tuners

NEW

Rolls easily!

. r

SAVE 7.07
PedestalTV Stand
Regular

3SJ9S
Value!

t

28

V

88

Western Auto hasthe Desf Catalog ordering system
- inoi vx nurw Western Auto Men can tell you in

COUP - it ! ..a.m.rrh9tvirtA ifMTl VOU Want ISm - seCOnQ5 II lire hi.vm h.wiv.iiw ,

SERVICE! in stockandwhen you canexpeci iogei u



SAVE

u9Sib

Pillow-Bac-k

Vinyl Recliner...

t
declarationof value!

j:::::sIi
wmi

P.A; 34.95 Value!

For...
Colorful patch-
work design Has
comfortablepad-
dedseat
chromedtubular
steelframe'

nMt - ' ..

trmmm ChooMtHc
l brown or ivocado

'ttV

SAVE

HAAA IQfl

3W'w
Regular99.95 Vauell lA'i'Jif

SAVE

14

Regular

Beautiful
SleeperStroller

Rugged 119JJ

room S

R -er.

kT& -

1)

for usl

a N.--?&: m

chargsIt I

(96
7-P-c. ModernDinetteSet...for
Comfortable& Stylish Dining!

Regular119.95Value Now.
CarefreeFormica tabletop with tube
steellegs Chairshavebutternut-colo- r
vinyl upholstery 36x48 tableextends

60' wide with leal (Included)

ffrTT F 'a

A(nVSuiHHHHiaaHHHMHaBjlBl aT-B-

'"""IrP'w- - "M ,0. 2e9bfac'
SAVE 39.96 NOW! HandsomeEasy-Car-e Vinyl Sofa Bed...
Use Credit to Enjoy ThisTerrific Bargain Right Now!

Regular759.95 Value Choice brown, black avocadovinyl
SAVE 19.961 Matching Vinyl EasyChair 74.99
SAVE 5.00! Maple-Finish-ed TableTrio 39.99
SAVE 1.961 Classic CeramicLamps 19.99

c. Set W43,45.5Z8270.3520(8J) 239.99

v Regular12.95 SAVE 3.96 W
Wh I T-

-! 9x12 Hard S

b --i V Myr
-- .

.- ? --- i.- -. . .- - :

to 12

--Z. a.

of or

2 .

W- -

'tr .

r-- j

m JULiLflu 3 SurfaceRug jiBt
I --- -SP Q99 fil

1 1 "

&3

79

119

v &

99
5077

MU)

"' -

Your

. 99
44.48(H)

NEW FREE SERVICE!

Western Auto has the
test Catalog ordering
system in town' Many
Western Auto Men can
tell you in secondsif the
major merchandiseitem
you want is in stock and
when you can expectto
getit'
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3

f

IBSI
M-Ob- bI

B WlZr ilm
BUOY MG SALE

ronW65MOW...
USE YOUR

CHAB6E ACCOUMT!

SAVE 4.07
Quality Carpet

ShampooerOnly

i AQ8S
teffttfar SZSSYakiel

m S M ntruter10S.9SValuer
Ideal "secondset" lor
kitchen.denvbedroom
Reliable solid state
audiocircuitry

!15 Front-mount- ed speaker
anaoperawtgcontrols
AraeaveweeaVained

JoreWi 0Qsyfefwcafeiwt

Bi

SAVE on 15 to.
PortableTV

llwar
Precision-etche-d

coppercircuitry
Front-mounte- d 3 in.
speakerandcontrols

HanasomoTV Stand
9J

SAVE 4.96Canister
Vac wrth HandyLift

Out Tool StorageTray

vr j

19 In. Portablewith
Stylish TV Stand

Aeevter

Vatoa
Ofly... 17999

WdtaBORof

Features100 solid statechassis
for fnstant-o-n ' performance
Woodgrain polystyrene cabinet
Large famify-siz- a viewing screen

W FBE SERVICE!
Western Auto hasme beetCatalog orderingSystem in town' Yes. many Western AutoMen can tell you in secondsif me marormerchandiseitem you want is in stockandwhen you canexpectto get it' y TSIBnaataataaaaaJ- ' g-- 3

I" dq zlaration of value! "f M
. .I o l i iLaaai

Tl I BP Upright Vac with FREE JIBc3 y Aountr! I ilr Accessories-- Charge It! flfl

i -- Tlf iiW II
- aaaaBBBBBBBaakw I if It I --"... HKI 5JS7w IMteralten) .BBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBBhk7 I i Hit- - I 3aPy vapv mwo lafaaaaeaal

B7!BaaaB!BaaBBBBBT If' dial control. Adjusts for low napsto BbbBbb!
M BBBBfTV I j o'wgs. inpie cleaningaction sucksup surface laBaagfgr.

iS Heavy-dut- y H " JaVaW J d,rt shakes,00so embeddeddirt combsnap' laffiBafi
g-- j powerfor f Sia&aV I afr IBtNJaalTTT 1 deepcleaning ' W'ttlaBBaaaPv Ifi SAVE J .aafcZ I "ILel actn! K&tSIKff, SIB Qi91f IIIP 1 Ideal for ' OtT ifi.L(KPr Bafc' j

1 f shagto indoor' Vl Aa "C A : iDlBaH
1 I outdoor! 0iA f i ?!! 'in .W lEtSSBSj
n Hasmulti-- """Lv I I rt b. B rSB

lSataVaVBajB. Ktee JVfl3 sw JlSlfe Convenient accessorykit in-- HiHaV
fiBSaVBBB NaiK. SW ASr? eludesupholstery & dusting BJBaaaW
'BaaaaaaaaaBa aaaaa: V-bb-

Il
brushes8 m. crevice tool 26 BaaaaatllnBBaaaj Vinylbumperguafdprotectstor-- in wanl and hoseadapter H SBBI

Nv. .J nrbire. With rug nozzle, crevice BmaaBaaaaaaP Everything you need. B Ba' tool, upholstery nozziD. dust BjBaaaaaa i JB
brush.2straight.1curved wand. g"" --4 3

iBBaaaaaBBaaaaaar.EIISaaaaaBaaaaaaa&???1Mhu) vaaeaanMwnj i ff Jaa

aaaaaaBaaaBBaaaaaBaaBaaaBBaaaaBaaBaWaaBSaBaaaaaSBaa agBaaaaajBjBaaaaaaaaaaaaaaBaaaaPaW',XBaal
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i

V7fc' Vl 119

SAVE 19.96NOW I

Rustic Boston-styl-e I

Rockerin Rich Pine jf
7Q99 Til

m m J
3in

Regular99.95Value
Dusky dark finish over qual-

ity Europeanpine. Features
gold-colore- d decorative
accents,carved splats &

arms. Has sturdy spindle
legs with cross membersfor
stability.

Charge
99

Regular
Handsome Herculon

upholstery
3 padding.

'Sturdy kiln-drie- d

hardwoodframe

Jfr""fi
Add It To

Your Account!

Many AssociateStorescangive you fast
confirmation of availability with their new
computerized ordering system, and have
your selection delivered to the store
promptly.

SAVE $10! 3 Pc. RedwoodSet

in.

Reg. 99.99 Setteeand2 Chairs! QQ
Redwoodframes with 5 in. foam- - 3&J
llliea cusnions.oeauiuui nurui
print vinyl covers wipe clean
easily.Sturdy steel springseats.

It!

146.95Buy

tweed
with

89
Openaconvenienteasy payaccount today!

02-- 4

a

Regular89.95 Values!
Both featurehigh pillow backs
with semi-attache- d design.
Contoured headrestshave 8"
polyfoam padding.

Sturdy hardwood frame and
no-sa- g steelspringsfor support.
Button tufting and pleated
skirts. Choose from bright au-

tumn floral or handsome
patchwork tweed. Don't miss
this'

Colonial Swivel Rockers
YOUR CHOICE!

SAVE $10
RedwoodChaise&
Two ChairsOnly

89
Add It To Your Account!
Redwood frames for
beautyand durability.
Chaisehaswheels for
easy movement. Foam-padde- d

cushionswith
vinyl covers and cotton
duckbacking.

I Iron Chair

17

99

Wrought

99
Regular 22.95Value

Settee39 in. wide 52- -
6525-1(3- )) 32.99
24" Round CoffeeTable

. . 14.99
36" RoundDining Table

..27.99

jysAujwgsntM AUTO A



mPj:

Regular

Rug
So
Reversibleand

wash-
able24x25",

several!

70c

5W

SAVE 44.96 Brilliant Blue VelvetSofa...
Add it Your Account andSaveNow!

Regular264.95VatoeNow Only...
Plush 90 in. sofa features deep-butto-n 2199Jtuning ana wainui-nmsne-a uim. vom-fortab- le

paddingoverdurable, kiln-drie- d

hardwoodframe.Hurry fn today!

t.bAVt 19.9b inuwi Matcntng luouiairKegutar ,Hfc.
nhi (MilllMMMIiiiiiMllirnn

llBPBmll llliUBBBHBlf

SAVE 34.96 NOW! Modern 5-P- c.

Living Room Group...Use
Your Credit and Enjoy it

mM

Value!

convenient!

machine

Buy

iHCisa
SAVE

rw&.HN
CandyStripe

1
iMfrotApsrr:

49

to

119.??

2.19

on

uwa
linn

229

8Kx11K Herculon
Plaid Carpet...Charge It!

Regular41.95 Buy pi qq
Cold black, red K99

beige Rugged! S)
11x1456-6034,35(8J-) 64.99

I

5SH70--

docl
qneurMMUMC

Table56-8-21

47.99

like

Has

mMiny AssociateStores ?S
pwnti ib.ive you fait confir- -

of with
their new

ordering system,and have
your selectiondelivered
to the store

....-.- . ..kr-.'- tr' am UKA. HHJmm
WHmmmi w ii

I ' 1

Herculon
Today!

Ft.

or
&

99
Amy km not ia

Matching Hexa-

gonal

computerized

264.95Value Thevery lateststyling!
5-- set includes sofa, club chair, cocktail table
and 2 end tables.Walnut-finishe- d wooden frames.
Thick cushions have Herculon Plaid upholstery.
Temperedglass tabletops.Assembles easily.

SAVE 16.96NOW!
EarlyAmericanCocktailTable
Regular66.95 Value
Tough vinyl finish
looks Pine!
Carved wood effects

in Dolvstvrene
decoratorshelf

availability

promptly.

Regular

USE YOUR CREDIT

4999

m
"1 ..... a. 4 wn

i

. .

H

. ir

. t . it a

.



mmam

!5rc r IF ifF

ROOM FULL
SAVINGS USE
YOUR CREDIT!

IT'S EASY TO

wfc-fssfi- v vj:
.- - "- - 5.v

&ezg-- ' . .i.HS
supca sva

iinr Myonujiiun i :,
iCoim Bith in Quillt--

Brjuty

t fit -

SAVE 54.86 NOW!
3-P- c. Provincial Bedroom
Set...just Say ChargeIt!

Regular
294.85
Value! 23999

Includes poster doubledresser,
framed Whiteenamel
Dresser durableMicarta

882-218- J)

Double Dresser 883-08- J) 114.99
Framed Mirror 884-8(8- J)

Night Stand 886-3(8- J)

Poster
Canopy 54.99

JK" lteg.2.29 Cotlon
24x18

WESTERN 2 A JTl.'S.'S..

&a
j V..

s

OF

1 ,.,-1- BP

""

4
mirror finish
has top

Chest56--1 79.99
56--1

56--1 44.99
56--1 49.99

4 Bed 56--1 888-9(8- J) 99.99
& Spread56--1 892--1 (8J)

i v .m

AUTO

a"Wl
:;5

jllJIIIP "& --v"", 71.95

- -. - v

W.681&J)

bed,

.
. .

.

,

-
I i
I F"" cover in I
" Z

ffiiff ua-a- T !

BL ""

OPEN A
SAVE 16.96

Twin-Siz-e Mattress
or Box Springs...
UseYour Credit!

99
be

A good night's sleep for sure1
Rayoncotton quilted cover,
foampadding Firmsteelcoils.
Full-Siz- e Mattress or Springs
561O00,0H8JEa 69.99

SAVE 70c
Bed

Pillow

i, 1
6(M

SSTQ02
QKM

Lightweight
aluminum frame!

Folding Bed
Reg.24.95 Buy-Fold-s

easily. Has
1" thick mattress.

jr" -- ."lll

lll HH 1

Hi

i !Tli

343.IIS
Value!

99
Include headboard triple drcs
scr and hutch wjth m.rror Oar
ptnrijn;h Drcwt r ha M ; srta
top Scalloptrimmed hutch ha
3 shelvesandplateglassmirror

Dresser . 139.S
H HutchMirror 56--1 .S

59.9
Chest56--1 576-0(- 8) .. ..124.9
Headboard56--1 578-6(- 8) 64.9

5R5S,Footboard . 59.9

Vfc 58J)

SAVE 4.96

Any item m4 in ftlocl

IHW L

IbbB B a HBb "

HHV mLHIIIIIIIIIh- - 4 f
' .1 ft BT" B - HIvaBCBMI

Polyfoam
For...

'

--rf&.-A 59

K

CHARGE

'

KUBf

.

lNighlMand5&-1574-5(8J- )

ACCOUNT!

wBSKmwlMISj

41199 U
lfcL.,i.i-MlBH- M

HH&vl.

SAVE 13.96NOW!
36ln.

WardrobeCabinet...
It To Your Account Now!

Reg.73.95
Brown enamel
finish. Rod,
shelf 36" W.

HquKUyMMU)!.

Yl

IBfc

TJg

Add

5999
5M0I1

5(8J)

42" WardrobeUnit 84.99
Deluxe Walnut-Graine- d 36" Wardrobe
Cabinet 56-40-1 74.99



PBt3

--Mr fSArAt UootiCJ T?JIB) 99Walnut Rrairn?d nzAdjustable 48 H (RU)

03

B at.. K

SAVE 3.96
Comfortable

Folding Chair

van
Reg.11.95Value

Craytubesteel,
contouredseat

PaddedCawl
TaWe56-8106--

9(8J).. 16.99

AD Western Auto AssociateStoresdo not stock furniture in their
ttom. but every Hem shownhere k quickly availablef ram a nearby
IMtnbutioo Center.Shopthis tale circular (and your WesternAuto
Catalog)lor your furniture need, find aselectionof evceBent

Many AssociateStore can give you Usl confirmation ofavailability
with their newcomputerizedorderingsystem andhaveyour selecton
deliveredk thestorepromptly '

(B) Metal Bookcase - I

Regular 11.49Value
Walnut-graine- Ad
justable.30 in. H

799
(Q Hutch Metal Bookcase
Reg.26.93 Buy JAQQ

Adjust- - M33
nU Mln M I
(D) 15-Sh- Metal Bookcase
Reg. 54.95Buy
Triple unit! Ad-

justable 60' H 39

(SJ)

99
l(V

USE YOUR CREDIT TO SAVE NOW!
HHyI'yBHH:JHHK4aHHMHHHHWV- -

"JStti """ iBMwL- .teniae JaHSW!lPHBMK.l

PJP
799

yotrll
values.

SAVE $30! 7-P-c. Dinette...UseYour Credit!
Regular 159.95Value With six chairs, tableand 12 in. leaf!
Walnut-graine- d laminatedplastic table top extendsto 60 in
with leaf Vinyl floral print upholstery

tf

SAVE 79.91!
StunningColonialSofa
andChair canbeYours

on OurCredit Plan!

269
Regular 349.90 Value In avocado!
Built with kiln-dnc- d frames & sturdy
steel spring for lasting support Re-ve-

b e box type sej' tusbions
( otter tweed
HexagonalTable 5fr 8-- 5 4 9 62.99
CocktailTable 56-82- 2 ,81 67.99

129

99

95
18J

iMn nwMS MITOTAi J


