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Friday, May 27 - - 
We can read about the past, 

Ilb we can dream about the 
future, but we must live in the 
present. Therefore, our actions 
should be based to a large 
extent on things as they 
prevail, right now. Somehow, 
we have the uneasy feeling 
that so many of our national 
and world leaders are living in 
the past and not even thinking 
about the future. 

Farwell High School 

Commencement Set 

Jay Anderson gets an assist 
from little sister Kelly as she 
pins a flower to Jay's gradua-
tion robe In preparation for 
"the big day." Jay is one of 26 
Farwell seniors who will 

Farwell seniors are counting 
the days until commencement 
exercises Friday, May 27, 
when they will graduate in 
ceremonies beginning at 8 p.m. 
in the school auditorium. 

of 1983 were at the school audi-
torium Sunday night, May 15. 
Jay and Kelly are the children 
of Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Anderson. 

receive diplomas in com-
mencement exercises at Far-
well High School Friday, May 
27, at 8 p.m. CDT. Baccalaure-
ate services honoring the class Rev. Don Holladay of Ham-

lin Memorial United Methodist 
Church will give the invoca-
tion. 

Honored At Banquet - - 

Don Malone, high school 
principal, will introduce the 
seniors and will make special 
award presentations, including 
scholarship announcements, 
Loving Cup, and the Cecil 
Dykes Citizenship Award. 

The JCCAs will also present 
a scholarship to a member of 
the graduating class. 

Benediction will be by Ralph 
Gates, minister of Farwell 
Church of Christ. 

Eunice Schilling and Charles 
Turner will play the proces- 

Anderson. Helen Armstrong, 
Shana Blain, Frank Cantu, 
Sandra Coates, Kelly Davis, 
Logan Dollar, Maribel Es-
trada, Gary Haseloff, Tim 
Hughes, Wade Kent, Jacque-
line Kube, Rocky Menning; 

Also, Billy Myers, Tammy 
Obenshain, Carlos Pena, Do-
mingo Rubio, Carrie Saldana, 
Irene Sanchez, Stephen Schil-
ling, Jennifer Stancell, Brenda 
Storholt, Polly Turner, Sandra 
White, Jennifer Williams, and 
Elva Yruegas. 

sional and recessional music, 
and the seniors will sing the 
school song at the close of the 
program. 

Honor guards will be Sheran 
Smallwood and Carla Martin-
ez, and ushers will be Geretta 
Hutchins and Alan Eubank. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Davis 
and Mr. and Mrs. Harlin 
Obenshain are the senior class 
parents, and class sponsors are 
Pat Graham, Dorris White, 
and Lucille Franse. 

Those graduating will be Jay 

Cheryl Scott, Earl Bibbs 

Texico's Top Athletes 

Honor Students Named - - 

I. Farwell Eighth Grade 

Graduation Is May 26 

• 
Texico 

Graduates 

Thursday 

We cannot explain how 

OD
Yasser Arafat can think war, 
let alone talk war with Israel. 
It was only yesterday that he 
got his Fannie whipped to a 
fraz and the PLO soundly de-
feated. It looks as if today's 
prudent action would be to lick 
his wounds and wait for better 
times in the years ahead, 

We cannot explain how cer- 
tain union chiefs can talk of 
wage raises when it was only 
yesterday that their company 
was on the edge of bankruptcy 
and there would be no Jobs at 
all. It looks as if today's pru-
dent action would be to allow 
the company to gain some 
measure of economic strength 
before trying to suck it dry 
again. 

We cannot explain how 
certain politicians can continu-
ally vote for the same econom• 
is policies that produced 20 
percent inflation and 25 per-
cent interest rates. It looks as 
if today's prudent action would 
be to cut the budget, hold the 
line on taxes, hang on to the 
present wage scales, and wait.  
for the country to also gain 
some economic strength before 
returning to the tired old liber-
al policies of the past. 

A gcod question might be: 
Have we really reached a time 
in the world and our country 
when there are no "states-
men," only greedy people and 
politicians? 

Cheryl Scott and Earl Bibbs 
were named Texico's best 
All-Around athletes Saturday, 
May 14, at the Wolverine 
Booster Club's annual athletic 
banquet honoring varsity and 
junior varsity' athletes. 

Karen Snodgrass and Lynn 
Tubbs were presented the 
Sportsmanship Awards. Ac-
cording to Coach Roy King, to 
be eligible for the sportsman-
ship award, the athletes must 
compete in three sports, have 
a good attitude, and "put 
everything they've got into the 
team and their effort." 

TLhe all-around athletes 
must letter in three sports, and 
Cheryl, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Keith Scott, qualified 
in basketball, volleyball, and 
track. 

In basketball she was named 
honorable mention on the All-
State team the past season, 
and was on the All-Tournament 
teams at the EPAC and Floyd 
tournaments. The sophomore 
was also named to the 6A All-
District volleyball team. She 
qualified for state competition 
in the discus and shot put 
events and emerged with a 2nd 
place in the discus and 7th 
place in shot put at the state 
track meet. 

Earl, the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Travis Bibbs, accomplished 
most of his athletic achieve-
ments in football where he was 

ne liardage, Alice Herrera, 
Daniel Hutchins, Rodney Is-
bell, Joe Ketcherside, Alex 
Lara, Steve Lara, Jacob 
Lopez, Jimmy Lovato, Melinda 
McMillan, Sharon Myers, Elo-
dia Ortega; 

And, Roy Perales, Teresa 
Rose, Daniel Rubio, Abel Sal-
dana, Jason Schilling, Keith 
Smith, Carey Stancell, Selene 
Stanton, Kenny Tally, Jerry 
Tomlinson, Devin Vaughan, 
Dana White, Robbie White, and 
David Woods. 

and recessional will be played 
by Eunice Schilling and Eliza-
beth Philllps. 

Graduate escorts from the 
seventh grade will be Robbie 
Fly, Joanna Castner, Dee Ann 
Ray, and Kelley Foster. Ush-
ers, also seventh graders, will 
be Laura Wolfe, Michele Sto-
ver, and Bony Nicolas. 

The Class Motto is "Climb-
ing Higher — Growing Wiser," 
Class sponsors are Pat Owen, 
Kay Ray, and JoLynda Robbs. 
Class parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Adams, Mr. and Mrs. 
Emiliano Lovato, Sr., and Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Schilling. 

Graduating from the eighth 
grade will be Kenneth Adams, 
Maria Anaya, Homer Anzal-
dua, Martin Arguelles, Ray-
mond Ausburn, Miles Brown, 
Camille Buchenau, Erik Bur-
ton, Monica Carpenter, Sean 
Childers, Dewayne Chisom, 
Jerry Cole, Randy Davis, Ur-
sula Dollar, Wesley Fish; 

Also, Shonda Foster, Suzan- 

Farwell eighth graders will 
receive their diplomas of grad-
uation at commencement ex-
ercises Thursday, May 26, at 
7:30 p.m. in the Farwell School 
Auditorium. 

Rev. J.L. Bass of Bovine, 
formerly of Farwell, will be 
the guest speaker. 

Honor students, Dana White, 
valedictorian, and Ursula Dol-
lar, salutatorian, will also give 
addresses. 

Wyatt Carpenter of the Okla-
homa Lane Baptist Church will 
give the invocation, and Leon-
ard Harris of the United Pent-
ecostal Church of Texico will 
give the benediction. 

W.M. Roberts, school super-
intendent, will introduce the 
guest speaker, and Jerry Dee 
Owen, junior high principal, 
will give the principal's ad-
dress. 

School board members Max-
ine Williams and Edward Corn 
will present the diplomas. 

Music for the processional 

Polly Turner, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles A 
Turner, will present the vale-
dictory address, and Kelly 
Davis, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jery Davis, will give the 
salutatory address. 

Jennifer Stancell, the daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Leamon 
Stancell, will give the class 
history. 

Presentation of diplomas will 
who have made special efforts be by school board members 
and show promise in the Floyd Coates, Joe Hughes, and 
seasons to come." 	 Richard Haseloff. 

Ruth Scott, senior, was 
awarded the Army Reserve 
National Scholar Athlete A-
ward. This award is presented.' 
to young athlete/scholars who 
have achieved excellence in 
both areas. The winners re-
ceive an inscribed medallion. 
Ruth is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Keith Scott. 

Special plaques were pre-
sented to athletes for being 
named in the AP or UP All-
State listings during the year. 
Those were awarded to Tom-
my Boarman, Allan Hadley, 
Lloyd Williams, Lynn Tubbs, 
Earl Bibbs, Ruth Scott, and 
Tammy Powell. 

Other athletic plaques were 
presented by the various 
coaches to those athletes 
named on All-District or All-
Tournament teams. 

Jesse Orozco, Student Coun-
cil president, accepted several 
team picture plaques on behalf 
of the school to be place in the 
school trophy cases. 

Coaches David Lynn and 
Roy King presented certifi-
cates to track athletes for their 
participation in the state track 
meet, giving highlights of the 
events and special recognition 
to those winning first place and 
setting records in the competi- 

(Continued on Page 2) 

••• 

Valedictorian Dana White is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert White. She has a grade 
average of 95, and has partici-
pated in UIL spelling and 
ready writing. 

She played the French horn 
in the junior high band, has 
been a junior high cheerleader, 
and will be a varsity cheer-
leader for high school next 
year. 

Dana is also active in ath-
letics. She played basketball 
and tennis and ran track this 
year. She also enjoys riding 
horses and has been a member 
of the High Plains Rodeo 
Association. 

named the Class A Back of the 
Year for the 1982 season, 
making the All-State first team 
as an offensive back, and the 
second team as a defensive 
back. Earl also qualified for 
the state track meet in the long 
jump. 

A sophomore, Karen Snod-
grass is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Snodgrass, and 
was a letterman in basketball, 
volleyball, and track. She was 
a part-time starter for the 
varsity Lady Wolverines, but 
was most successful in track 
where she captured the state 
championship in the high jump 
event at the recent state track 
meet. 

Lynn Tubbs, the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hurley Tubbs, played 
football and basketball, and 
ran on the track teams for the 
Wolverines. In football he was 
named by Associated Press 
and United Press International 
as a first team All-State line-
backer, and ran on the mile 
relay team which qualified for 
state competition. 

The Fighting Heart Awards 
went to Chary Jesko, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Roger Jesko, 
Ronnie Galvan, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Galvan, and 
Ronnie Dunsworth, son of Mr 
and Mrs. Eddie Dunsworth. 

According to Texico coaches, 
"The Fighting Heart Awards 
are given to undergraduates 

Texico High School gradua-
tion ceremonies were set for 
Thursday, May 19, in Wolver-
ine Gym beginning at 7 p.m. 
MDT. 

Graduating honor students 
were Sharlet Taylor, valedic-
torian; Ruth Scott, salutator-
ian; and Tammy Powell, his-
torian. Each of the honor 
students was to give a speech 
during the ceremonies. 

Members of the junior class, 
Chary Jesko, Dana Morris, 
Scott Elliott, and Brad Stew-
ard, were to be graduate es-
corts, with Terri Fenn, Valda 
Cavallero, Tobin Tate, and Joe 
Steward as ushers. 

Kenneth Shaw, principal, 
was to introduce the seniors, 
and diplomas were to be pre-
sented by school board mem-
bers Arlye Crooks and Herman 
Geries. 

Georgia Tharp was to pro-
vide the processional and 
recessional music. 

James Harding, school coun-
selor, was to present the schol-
arship awards, and Bettie 
Martin was to present special 
music for the evening. 

DANA WHITE URSULA DOLLAR 

Ursula Dollar, salutatorian, 
is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Dollar. She has a 
94.63 grade average for the 
year. 

She plays the drums for the 
junior high band, and has 
received an award from the 
United States Achievement 
Academy. 

Ursula played basketball and 
ran track this year. She enjoys 
reading, swimming, and being 
outdoors. 

Beard Contest 
Underway 

May 28 

Suspect In Custody 

For Theft Of Pickup 

••• 

So you think it has been 
cool? Well, it has been, but is it 
all that unusual? No, not 
really. 

One of the advantages of 
• running a newspaper is the 

access to files that reflect all 
sorts of things, including the 
weather last year and the year 
before that, and the year, etc., 
etc. By going and looking at 
the news and columns about 
this time in the years ago, we 
can only conclude that the 
weather is acting pretty nor-
mal for this time of the year. 

• It sterns that at this time we 
all are striving mightily to 
have the good old summer 
time arrive early, and any 
deviation from our desires is 
looked upon as abnormal. In a 
month from now we could be in 
the middle of our hottest time 
of the year. It often is, and we 
have often commented on that 
fact. This is again part of our 
human tendencies to view 

• things not as they are but only 
as we want them. 

••• 

Politicians will be politi-
cians, or there's where the 
money goes. The Texas higher 
educational system now in-
cludes 34 public senior col-
leges, eight medical facilities, 
and four technical institute 
campuses. Plus, tshe state 

• provides a large portion of the 
financial support for 47 public 
junior colleges. 

Yet., in various stages of the 
legislative process are propos-
als to: change a two-year 
upper-division to a four-year 
school-, establish a new univer-
sity system administration 
component; create a new 
School of Podiatry; provide 
almost total state financing of 
a deaf institute; and authorize 

• a new technical institute. 
These additional expendi-

tures are contemplated in spite 
of the fact that enrollment 
growth in public senior schools 
will likely be less than one 
percent per year to the end of 
this decade. 

We have no statesmen, only 
politicians. 

Outstanding Athletes 

• ••• 

Definition of the Week: Poli-
ticians itinerary: Babble Belt. 

Black Fertilizer in Black 
reported Tuesday, May 10, that 
$3,000 worth of chemicals had 
been taken in a burglary at 
that business. 

Barry Weaver of Clovis re-
ported that Ill was taken from 
his locker at the Excel plant on 
Tuesday, May 10. 

Alvin Hernandez of Bovirla 
reported Monday, May 16, that 
his car had been broken into 
while parked in the Excel 
parking lot. Taken were a 
stereo and speakers; estimated 

(Continued on Page 3) 

gated. In addition, six arrests 
were made in the county dur-
ing the past week. 

Peggy Snider reported on 
Tuesday, May 10. that someone 
had damaged the lawn in front 
of the Twin Oaks business in 
Farwell. apparently with a 
motorcycle. 

In another vandalism case, 
Deaf Smith County Electric 
Cooperative reported some 
transformers in the northeast 
corner of Parmer County had 
been damaged. The report 
came in Thursday, May 12. 

Parmer County Sheriff Bill 
Morgan reports that Russell 
Phillip; is in custody in Okla-
borne City, Okla., in connection 
with the alleged theft of a 1976 
pickup truck which was re-
ported stolen by Ed Clark of 
Friona on Friday, May 13. The 
vehicle was recovered in Okla-
homa City, and Phillips is 
awaiting transfer to Parmer 
County. 

In other activities of the 
sheriffs department, repOrts 
of vandalism and burglary m 
the county are being invests- 

MI you gents who are plan-
ning to go unshaven in hopes of 
winning a plaque at the 
upcoming Border Town Days 
festivities are reminded that 
the annual BTD Beard Grow-
ing contest gets underway 
Saturday. May 7B. 

At that time Red Lonsdale at. 
the Farwell barber shop will 
check your growth of whiskers. 
making sure no contestant 
starts his beard before May S. 

For those who do not wish to 
participate in the contest. 
Beard Growing Permits will be 
available for SI each and 
may be purchased from Red at 
the barber shop or from BTD 
Marshal Ralph Gates. 

Marshal Gates plans to take 
a close gander at all the male 

named on the All-State Team faces around town from now 
listings. Cheryl Is a sopho- until BTD. enforcing the law 
more, and Earl is a senior. 	by issuing fines to those with- 

out beards or permits. 

May It. Both these athletes 
have beer named All-Tourna-
ment players. were All-District 
selections• and have been 

Cheryl Scott and Earl Bibbs 
received the Outstanding %th-
ine awards at the Texico 
Athletic banquet Saturday. 

URLEY 
ERSONAL 

dim= by John.. 

Get It Right 

r. 
t 



Boarman, Ronnie Dunsworth, 
Scott Elliott, Jeff Holland, Opie 
Kelley, Rudy Martinez, Elias 
Orozco, Duane Robinson, Brad 
Steward, Tobin Tate, Terry 
Tubbs, Kevin West, Joe Stew-
ard, Billy Bibbs, Jeff Camp-
bell, Ronnie Galvan, Rusty 
McCormack, Danny Powell, 
Jay Robinson, and Richard 
Hernandez. 

Senior T's were presented to 
the senior athletes, and it was 
noted that this will be the last 
year they will be awarded as 
Senior T's. 

According to the Moslem 
book, The Koran, the for-
bidden -fruit-in the Garden 
of Eden was a banana, not 
an apple. 
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Rites Held Friday 

For Deward Armstrong 
Fighting Heart Award 

the Clovis area in 1962 where 
he made his home until recent-
ly. 

He is survived by his wife 
Betty; two daughters, Linda 
Autrey of Ruidoso and Cynthia 
Chumley of Clovis; two sons, 
Terry of Grants, N.M., and 
Kent of Texico. He is also 
survived by 10 grandchildren; 
one brother, Charles (Sonny) 
of Dimmitt; five sisters, Marie 
Marler of Lorenzo, Alene Lil-
ley, Mozelle Lilley, and Jo 
Hankins, all of Dimmitt; and 
Nell Brooks of Amarillo. 

He was preceded in death by 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. J.P. 
Armstrong, a brother, C.J., 
and one grandchild. 

Sportsmanship Awards Funeral services were held 
Friday, May 13, for Deward M. 
Armstrong, 54, of Ruidoso, 
formerly of Clovis. Mr. Arm-
strong died Tuesday, May 10, 
in a tractor mishap in Ruidoso. 

Services were conducted at 
the First United Methodist 
Church in Hart, with Rev. 
Lyman Woods officiating. In-
terment was in the Hart 
cemetery with Parsons Funer-
al Home of Dimmitt in charge. 

Mr. Armstrong was a farmer 
and most recently was in the 
trucking business. He was born 
October 3, 1928, in Sunnyside, 
Tex., where he resided for 
many years. He was married 
to Betty Brooks on July 25, 
1948, in Hart. They moved to 

Wolverine Booster Club Satur- 
day night. The award is given 
to undergraduates for showing 

Texico Fighting Heart awards 
were presented to Ronnie Gal-
van, left, Chary Jesko, and 
Ronnie Dunsworth at the 
athletic banquet hosted by the 

outstanding promise in sports 
as well as their past efforts 
and participation. cipients was characterized as 

having been good team mem-
ben, and having always given 
100 percent of their efforts to 
the team. 

Saturday, May 14. The sports-
manship awards are based 
on an athlete's participation in 
three sports, his attitude and 
effort. Each of this year's re- 

Karen Snodgrass and Lynn 
Tubbs received the Sports-
manship Awards at the annual 
Texico Athletic Banquet hosted 
by the Wolverine Booster Club HEREFORD 

Hereford, Texas (Continued from Page 1) Texico's Top Athletes . . . 
tion. 

Master of ceremonies, Junior 
Foreman, introduced each 
coach as well as other speak-
ers for the evening. He also 
introduced the new Booster 
Club officers for next year. 

Among the recognition given 
by the master of ceremonies 

CATTLE COMM. CO. 

omin 
soon 

Services Held For Mrs. Roy Melugin 

Weekly Cattle Auction 

Frank Dillon, Joe Fahnert, 
Stanley Glenn, Hollis Grissom; 

Also, Hurshel Harding, Ro-
bert Vivian, Duane Howard, 
Dr. V. Scott Johson, Otto 
Kaptina, Dean Kilmer, Pren-
tice Mills, Jon Pressley, Travis 
Stovall, Jim Turner, Jim 
Turnbough, Roy Walker, Earl 
Whitten, Dennis Willard, Ver-
non Willard, Sherman Wil-
liams, and T. E. Willmon. HEREFORD CATTLE COMM. CO. 

5 miles Southwest of Herefo d 

*Box 1804 -357,2272 
Steve Hodges Mgr. 

etta Gonzales, Chary Jesko, 
Ronnie Dunsworth, Opie Kel-
ley, Ronnie Galvan, Rusty 
McCormack, Danny Powell, 
Doug Thornton, Lonnie Smith, 
Bobby Steward, Mark Meeks, 
Stanley Cross, and Jeff Camp-
bell. 

Lady Wolverine Varsity ath-
letes receiving letters were 
Tammy Powell, Ruth Scott, 
Christi Barfield, Valda Caval-
lero, Chary Jesko, Dana Mor-
ris, Terri Fenn, Elayne Hor-
ner, Toby Odle, Cheryl Scott, 
Karen Snodgrass, Kathy Har-
rison, Helen Jo Boarman, Coy 
Jo Burk, Loretta Gonzales, 
Rhonda Henson, Carrina Hun-
gerford, Lucia Jesko, Kelly 
Lynn, Katie Tubbs, ElDonna 
McCormack, Maria Jimenez, 
Melanie Furrow, Donna Smith, 
Michelle Lebow, Tammy San-
doval, and Tracey McDonald. 

Wolverine athletes receiving 
letters were Billy Askew, Earl 
Bibbs, Allan Hadley, Bob 

CiSohnson, Robert Meier, Jesse 
Orozco, Danny Reid, Lynn 
Tubbs, Lloyd Williams, Kevin 
Akers, Dale Autrey, Tommy 

was the effort put forth by the 
Booster Club members in 
making the banquet possible. 
He gave special recognition to 
those who worked on the dec-
orations, which included a 
moving carousel, streamers, 
and school trophies dating 
back to the 1930's. 

Dianne Parker, cheerleader 
sponsor, gave awards to the 
Texico cheerleaders, Sharla 
McDonald and Rachel Jara-
millo. They in turn presented 
her with a gift of thanks as 
well as giving a special gift to 
Kay Warmuth, school secre-
tary, for assistance and en-
couragemment. 

Oran Jay Autrey received an 
award from the Booster Club 
for his work with the elemen-
tary age children in teaching 
them the rules, regulations, 
and some of the finer points of 
basketball. 

Members of the junior war- 
', sity teams receiving certifi-

cates for their participation 
--were Dana Morris, Elayne 

Horner, Toby Odle, Coy Jo 
Burk, Lucia Jesko, Kelly Lynn, 
Tammy Dosher, Tonya Duns-
worth, Melanie Furrow, Bren-
da Morris, Melissa Singleterry, 
Carrina Hungerford, ElDonna 
McCormack, Katie Tubbs; 

Also, Maria Jimenez, Terri 
Fenn, Helen Jo Boarman, Lor- 

To Subscribe 

Just Phone 

481-3631 

Texas and New Mexico. She 
was an active member of the 
First United Methodist Church 
of Clovis, a member of the 
Hospital Auxiliary, Altrusa 
Club and Progress Club. 

Survivors include her hus-
band, Roy of the home; one 
son, Roy Jr. of Sherman, Tex.; 
and two granddaughters. She 
was preceded in death by a 
son, John Harris Melugin on 
April 20, 1946. Pallbearers 
were Harlan Beasley, Larry 
Glenn, Art Hutchins, Ray 
Lofton. Norris McWilliams, 
Willard Patterson, Grady 
Pierce, and Harry Johnson. 

Honorary bearers were Wil-
liam Akers, Don Alderman, 
G.D. Anderson Jr., Robert 
Anderson, E.C. Armstrong, 
Harry Barton, Davenport 
Beasley, Edwin Cain, W.C. 
Delk, Dr. Michele deMain 

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Ruby Melugin, 81, of Clovis 
who died Tuesday, May 10, at 
Clovis High Plains Hospital, 
were conducted Friday, May 
13, frOm the First United 
Methodist Church in Clovis. 
Officiating were Rev. Roland 
McGregor, and Rev. Joe 
Emanuel. 

Interment was in Lawn 
Haven Memorial Gardens un-
der the direction of Steed-Todd 
Furkral Home. 

Mrs. Melugin was born 
August 25, 1901, near Cisco, 
Tex., and grew up near 
Snyder. She attended college ht 
West Texas, and Las Vegas 
Highlands, and received her 
B.A. at ENMU in 1954. 

She was married to Roy 
Melugin August 29, 1928, in 
Snyder, and they have taught 
in numerous school systems in 

1 I 
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PAW. 
PEARSON 

JOE 
BACA 

2400 MABelf DR. 	HAGELGANTZ 
Big Country Ford And Subaru 



FARM INSURANCE 
AGENCY, INC. 

We Work For You 

Box 245 - Ph. 481-9372 Farwell, Texas 

	

Oriental Stucco 	 t9.95 

	

Masonry Cement 	 44.25 

	

Portland Cement 	 $4.95 

Storm Windows 	$30.00 & Up 

Insulation-Fiberglass 	 $ .18 Per Sq. Ft. 

FREE DELIVERY TO 
TEXICO FARWELL 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

1201 E. First Clovis 763-4437 

Per Month 

36 Monthly Payments Of 
'52.98 Each. Cash Sole 
Price Of '1591.00. Soles 
Tax '67.95. Total Cash 
Price '1666.95. Down Pay-
ment Of '300.00, Interest 
'540.33. Total Of Payments 
'1907.28. Deferred Pay-
ment Price '207.28. APR 
22.40'. Financing Thru 
Western Bank Of Clovis 
Upon Approval Of Credit, 

25" DIAGONAL REMOTE 
CONTROL HOME ENTERTAINMENT 
CENTER MODEL J2574RD 

■ Simulaled Dark Oak Wood grained Finish 
• Classic Styling 
• 134 Channel Electronic Tuning System 
■ AMIFM Receiver we. 8 Track Player 8 

Cassette PlayertRecorder 
• BeltiDrive Record Changer II Auto Color 
II LED Channel Number Display 
II Quality Speaker System ■ Casters 

36 Monthly Payments Of 41.99 Per Month. Cosh Sale Price Of 
'1279.00, Sales Tax '54.35. Total Cosh Prices '1333.35. Down Pay-
ment Of '250.00. Interest '428.29, Payment Price '1761.64. APR 
22.41'. Financing Thru Western Bank Of Clovis Upon Approval 
01 credit. 

25" DIAGONAL REMOTE CONTROL 
COLOR CONSOLE H2554RK 
WITH SOUNDWIDE-. H6Ft AUDIO SYSTEM 
• RonScr. Acc.a Intramil Remote Tunov 
• IOS Gunn,/ Tunng Canabibtp 
• VIA ry Stixho Duality Grey - 
• 24.1loa pock and Tyre 
• 2-Channei Av00 Stmarn Provide Sernand 

St-ets 
• ServillEICO•inomai Fruaood Gruned Firush 

FREE 
With Your Purchase 

Of A Selected 

Console TV, VCR, 
or Audio System 

Receive 

FREE 
CEILING FAN 

$090 Per  
Month 

WHY ARE CURTIS MATHES 

T.V.'s AND VCR's 

"WORTH IT'? onnnoaboouncooao  

VIDEO CASSETTE RECORDER 
WITH STEREO 
DELUXE TABLE MODEL HV754 
• Stereo Reproduction of Stereo Recorded Tapes 
• 4 Record and Playback Heads 
• Wireless Remote Control 
• 14 Dayal Event Programmable Timer 
• Electronic Tuning with 105 Channel Capability 
• One Touch Record Feature 

• 4 YEARS OF WARRANTY ON ALL 
ELECTRONIC PARTS 

• 4 YEARS LABOR WARRANTY IN-
CLUDING PICKUP 8, DELIVERY 
AND A FREE LOAN T.V. OR VCR 
IF YOURS CAN'T BE FIXED IN 
YOUR HOME 

• OUR DEDICATION TO SERVE YOU 
BETTER THAN YOU'VE EVER BEEN 
SERVED BEFORE 36 Monthly Payments Of 44.90 P.r Month. Cash Sole Price '1399.00. 

Sales Tax '59.45 Total Cosh Price '1458.45. Down Payment 01 
'300.00 Interest '457.95 Total Price '1916.40. APR 22.40'. Financ-
ing Thru Western Bank Of Clovis Uoon Approval 04 Credit 

SUPER SAVINGS FROM CURTIS MATHES 

Curtis Mathes 
Curtis Mathes 

No one but Curtis Mathes 
offers you this exclusive 
4-Year Limited Warranty 
on every electronic part, 
including the picture tube. 
See your dealer for 
complete details 

OPEN MON. THRU SAT. 
9AMTO6PM 

OM 1 111111118 

11 NIL 1 UMW 11411111 

FOUR 

HOME ENTERTAINMENT CENTER 
YEAR 

1611 N. Prince 762-3'AR7V 4RA"  3N  

THE ONLY AUTHORIZED CURTIS MATHES DEALER IN CLOVIS. 
Free Delivery 

Within 100 Miles 

SPRING FEVER TV SPECIALS 
HORMEL BLACK LABEL SLICED 

69 
	BACON 	1 

PKG.  LB 

COBBLERS 
PET RITZ-APPLE-CHERRY-PEACH 	$ a 1 29 

28 OZ. 
PKG. 

BANANAS 19e,B TOMATOES 59c 
10LB. BAG 	an  c  

POTATOES LETTUCE 391EAD 

TORTILLA
IIB I 
	CHIPS 1 29  

AL

BREAD
LSUP S 1% LB. LOAF 

49c 

EGGSH

SHURFRES 	49c  MEDIUM 	

DOZ. 

ALLSUP'S 

MILK 
1 GALLON $199  

COOKED FOOD SPECIAL Of THE WEEKI 

HOT LINKS 	B-B-OUE 

2/89e 	
SANDWICH 

99 READY TO GO AT ALLSUP'S FAST FOOD-CENTERS! 

AILS UP 
PRICES EFFECTIVE 
MAY 19.21,1989 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST! 

OPEN 21 HOURS 

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE! 

SELF SERVE GAS 
CONVENIENCE STORES 
	 Aess•-•-e's  

BORDEN'S 	 R c 
COTTAGE CHEESE ge 

BORDEN'S PUDDING 

PUDDING 
BARS 

diO 
6 CT. 
PKG. 

ALLSUPS c 
MONEY ORDERSONLY  I U 

COCA-COLA 

3C 
EACH $219 

BTL. 
6 PACK NON-RETURNABLE 

SINGLE 
BOTTLES 
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14 To Graduate - 

Lazbuddie Graduation 

Slated Tuesday, May 24 

MARK LUST 
Valedictorian 

KIM GREGORY 
Historian 

BART ELLIOTT 
Salutatorian 

mencement exercises in the 
school cafeteria. 

Members of the class include 
Rickie Dale, Bart Elliott, 
Jimmy Garcia, Kim Gregory, 
Ginny Guy, Frank Jesko, Jeff 
Jesko, Mark Lust, Casey 
McBroom, Trestia Moore, Dan-
ny Powell, Julian Ovalle, Dan-
iel Schacher, and Joe Dan 
Tarter. 113 Prospective Jurors Called 

Fourteen seniors will receive 
their diplomas at Lazbuddie 
High School graduation exer-
cises slated for Tuesday, May 
24, at 8 p.m. in the high school 

je auditorium. 
Guest speaker will be David 

Bennett of the Church of Christ 
in Lazbuddie. 

Honor students are Mark 
Lust, valedictorian; Bart El-
liott, salutatorian; and Kim 
Gregory, historian. 

Presenting the diplomas will 
be Sam P. Barnes, superin-
tendent, assisted by Larry 

• Jesko. 
Graduate escorts will be 

Sharon Glover, Lauan Brock-
man, Ralph Gonzales, and Lee 
Scott. 

The senior class motto is 
"We will never stop reaching 
for new goals." Their sponsors 
are Elizabeth Queener and 
Rick Copp. 

The processional and reces-
sional music will be provided 
by Adeana Carlyle. 

There will be a reception 
honoring the graduates im-
mediately following the com- 

of the National Honor Society. 
Salutatorian Bart Elliott is 

the son of Mr. and Mrs. Ronald 
Elliott. He has a four-year 
grade average of 92. Bart 
participated in football, bas-
ketball, tennis, and track. He 
received All-District and All-
state honors in football. 

Bart is a member of the 
National Honor Society, and 
has served as a class officer 
and an FFA officer. He was 
also a member of the Student 
Council. 

Kim Gregory, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Claud Gregory, 
Jr., will read the class history. 
She has a four-year grade 
average of 90. Kim has partic-
ipated in basketball for four 
years, and has been a cheer-
leader for four years. 

She is president of the 
Student Council, a member of 
the National Honor Society, 
and served as secretary of the 
senior class. She is a member 
of FHA and has served as an 
officer for three years. In 
addition, Kim has shown 
livestock through the FFA. 

othy Brown, Linda Knowles, 
Myra Snyder, Allo Reeve, 
Raymond Eugene Houston, 
Harry Johnson, Doyle Johnson, 
Raymond Treider, Carl Gene 
Lowe, Anita Bynum, M.C. 
Morgan, Jr., Ann Lovelace, 
Michael Don Read; 

And, Bonnie Warren, Mur-
lene Gaines, Sharon Thornton, 
J.R. Euler, John Carl Southall, 
Sherry Moore, Karen Kirkpat-
rick, Richard Lynn Carson, 
Joy Patterson, Ramiro Gon-
zalez, Tommy Lee Tatum, Joe 
Ridley, June Floyd, Gilbert 
Boatman, Charles Allen Stew-
art, Kenneth Wayne Gauntt, 
and Ruth Meeks. 

Lazbuddie 8th graders will 
graduate Thursday, May 26, at 
8 p.m. Commencement will be 
in the Lazbuddie School Audi-
torium. 

••• 

Valedictorian Mark Lust is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Lust. He has a four-year grade 
average of 94. Mark partici-
pated in football, basketball, 
tennis, track, and golf, and re-
ceived All-District and All-
South Plains honors in football. 

He has served as an FFA of-
ficer four years and has been a 
member of the Student Council 
and the National Honor Soci-
ety. Mark also served as a 
class officer and as president 

Arrests Made . . . (Continued from Page 1) 

value of the items is $400. 
Sheriff Morgan also reported 

six arrests this week, the first 
being that of Jeffrey Peters, 

411 23, of Friona. He was arrested 
on a warrant from Bailey 
County by Parmer County 
Sheriff's officers on Tuesday, 
May 10, and transferred to 
Muleshoe. 

Rafael Torres, 33, of Friona, 
was arrested by sheriff's 
officers on Saturday, May 14, 
on a warrant from Cast 
County. He was transferred to 
Dimmitt. 

ID 

	

	Also on Saturday, Valentine 
Espinoza, 23, of Bovina was 
arrested by county officers and 
Texas Highway Patrol officers 

Also, Calvin Talley, Nancy 
Winegeart, Maudie Thurman, 
Mrs. Fidencio Guzman, Billy 
Craft, Pat Owen, Mildred 
Haseloff, James Douglas Zeh-
ncr, Felipe Flores, Cordie V. 
Potts, Eileen Chitwood, Jodean 
Harrelson, Denver Hardin Duf-
fey, Elva Kelley, Eddie Mays, 
Edna Estes; 

And, Paulino Rios, Laurance 
R. Hand, Herman Estes, Ruby 
Steinbock, Margaret Charles, 
Carlene Jones, Mrs. Rafael 
Gonzales, Arthur 0. Gast, 
Doris Martin, Doris Gerber, 
Gilbert Stephen Lueras, Car-
oline Anderson, Virginia Coro-
nado, Geraldine Taylor, Steve 
Bavousett, Joe A. Wilhem; 

Also, Velma Engelking, Scott 
Gober, H. Boyd White, Cecelia 
Parham, Alan Dale Sikes, Nel-
line Spicer, Mark William Os-
born, Nancy Edelmon, Jessie 
Carothers, Linda Louise Ches-
her, Bessie Riethmayer, Rob-
ert William Zetzache, Lillie 
Christian, Ronnie W. Spence, 
Lois Billingsley, John Herman 
Schelter; 

And, Mrs. Domingo Rubio, 
Robert Allman, Eldon Wayne 
Thatcher, Anita Foster, Anne 
Norton, Dexter Allen, Oma 
Lewis Judd, Shirley Burton, 
Joyce Johnson, Frederick Jen-
nings, Lola White, Bob Lew-
ellen, Noyle Eric Wood, Tulon 
White O'Brian, Alfred Lee 
Hicks, Michael Scott Miller; 

Also, Scott Watkins, Mary 
Maddox, Weltha Nibert, Dor- 

• 

for DWI. He has been released 
on $1,000 bond pending County 
Court action. 

Bovina Police Department 
officers arrested Manuel Her-
nandez, 41, of Bovina on 
Saturday, May 14, for DWI. He 
was fined $300 plus court costs, 
and assessed 10 days in jail. 

Kenny Wayne Austin, 26, of 
Friona was arrested by county 
sheriff's officers and Texas 
Highway Patrolmen Saturday, 
May 14, for DWI. He was fined 
$200 plus court costs and given 
30 days with six months defer-
red adjudication. 

On Sunday, May 15, Jerry D. 
Cooper, 34, of Texico was 
arrested by THP officers on a 

charge of DWI. He was fined 
$200 plus court costs and asses-
sed three days in jail. 

District Court 
Results 

Two cases were heard by 
District Judge Jack D. Young 
in Parmer County District 
Court Friday, May 13. 

Rex Byrd, 32, of Clovis had 
his probation revoked, and he 
was sentenced to serve three 
years in the Texas Department 
of Corrections. 

Lewis Vasquez, 25, of Friona 
pled guilty to theft, and was 
given four years probation. 

One hundred thirteen per-
sons have been summoned by 
Parmer County Sheriff Bill 
Morgan as prospective jurors 
for the May 23 session of the 
287th District Court of Parmer 
County. 

The prospective petit jurors 
are to report to the District 
Court Room in the County 
Courthouse at 10 a.m. on 
Monday, May 23. All persons 
listed have been mailed a 
summons. 

Eight cases are on the 
docket, with District Judge 
Jack D. Young to preside. 

Cases scheduled include Joe 
Fallwell vs. Friona Transport, 
et al; W. Doyle Elliott vs. D.T. 
King; Tito Rodriguez vs. Com-
mercial Union Ins. Co.; Alex 
R. Bonney vs. Commercial 
Union Ins. Co.; Concepcion C. 
Garcia vs. Commercial Union 
Ins. Co.; Victor Sanchez vs. 
Commercial Union Ins Co.; 
and Jean Chandler vs. Com-
mercial Union Ins. Co. (two 
cases). 

Those summoned to report 
include: 

Carolyn Burrows, Weldon 
Randolph Dickson, Patti Ry-
burn, Jean Travis, Arlin Leroy 
Hartzog, Jr., Jimmie Lee 
Cockerham, James P. Forten-
berry, Annie Hutson, Martin 
Kube, Billy Darrell Smith, 
Pamela Ann Haseloff, James 
H. Corbell, D.L. Harquess, 
Tammie Turner, Mrs. Jimmie 
Heard, L.D. Taylor; 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 



DEBORAH J. PENNER DENISE CHRISTIAN 

GET A HORSE! 
WILLIAM JENNINGS BRYAN 

WAS THE FIRST PRESIDEN- 
TIAL CANDIDATE TO RIDE 

A ...MORSELEGG CARRIAGE? 
T}iE EVENT TOOK PLACE 

IN 1896. THERE WERE 
KNOWN TO BE ONLY I0 

AUTOS IN THE WHOLE COUNTRY 

FACTORY AUTHORIZED 

SALES • SERVICE • PARTS 
FOR IHC EQUIPMENT 

Satisfaction Guaranteed! 

WOOLEY 
INTERNATIONAL 

Muleshoe 
Ph. 806/272-5514 

Service Crew 
Radio Dispatched 

See Terry Yell 

*ma f 0® BUICK 

Y 
PON11AC 

GMC 

ROBERT D. GREEN, INC. 
2400 Wol Amnia., Sivil 

MULESHOE, TEXAS T9341 

Kids Learn To Bank 

On Their Allowance 

Receives 
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Denise Christian 

Graduates Sat. Law Degree 

How do you teach children to 
manage money? One father 
decided to develop his own 
checking account system for 
his 7-year-old son. 

"This father said his son had 
no idea where money came 
from or how it should be spent. 
He just wanted to buy 
whatever he saw," said Jackie 
Martin, Extension family fi-
nance specialist at New Mex-
ico State University. 

The father created what he 
calls the Kiddycheck system. A 
child deposits his allowance 
with his banker (mom or dad), 
and when he needs cash, he 
writes a check which his 
parents redeem. 

The 7-year-old and his 6-
year-old brother deposit their 

CHARY JESKO LUCIA JESKO 

Are Award Winners 

Ruth Scott 

Hospitalized 

$4 and $2 allowances each 
Friday. They cash checks to 
buy staples such as candy or 
comic books. 

"These children balance 
their checkbook," Mrs. Martin 
said. "Overdrafts have occur-
red, but that is what the learn-
ing process is all about." 

Pleased that Kiddychecks 
have been successful with his 
own children, the father, Matt 
Beha, is selling a system to 
other parents, Mrs. Martin 
said. A kit which includes a 
checkbook, a record-keeping 
ledger and an instruction 
sheet, sells for $3. It can be 
ordered from Kiddycheck 
Company, Department MM, 
P.O. Box 25044, Lansing, Mich. 
4890 

Janell Garrett Receives Degree 

Denise Christian of Farwell 
recently received her Bachelor 
of Science degree in home 
economics with a specializa-
tion in education from Texas 
Tech University, Lubbock. 

Graduation ceremonies were 
Saturday, May 14, at Texas 
Tech University Center Thea-
tre. Mrs. Christian was one of 
150 home economics graduates 
participating in ceremonies. 

She graduated "cum laude" 
with a 3.5 grade point average 
out of a possible 4.0. She was 
involved in Phi Upsilon Omi-
cron, a home economics hon-
orary, and was on the Dean's 
List every semester. She re-
cently completed her student 
teaching at Dimmitt High 
School. 

Attending the ceremonies 
were her husband Vick; her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Tom Young of Kress; Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Christian, Mr. and 
Mrs. Donald Christian, and 

Carrie Christian, all of Far-
well; 

Also, Sharmy Christian, 
Darren Young, Charles Chris-
tian, and Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Darnell, all of Lubbock; and 
Mrs. June Darnell and Mrs. 
Phyllis Crume, both of Amar-
illo. 

All of the group enjoyed a 
special dinner at the Fifty 
Yard Line restaurant Friday 
night. 

Chary and Lucia Jesko, 
daughters of Mr. and Mrs. 
Roger Jesko, and students at 
Texico High School, have been 
named as recipients of United 
States Achievement Academy 
awards. 

Chary received her award in 
business education, being 
nominated by Ann Liethen, 
business instructor. 

She is a junior and is active 
in sports as well as academic 
functions. Her award was pre-
sented on the recommendation 
of Mrs. Liethen, as well as her 
scholastic abilities and partic-
ipation in school activities. 

Lucia's award is for math, 
with the nomination coming 
from Ronnie Warmuth, high 
school math instructor. 

Lucia is a freshman, and is 
also active in sports and 
several school organizations. 
Her award is also the result of 
her academic abilities and 
leadership qualities. 

Both girls will appear in the 
Achievement Academy Official 
Yearbook to be published 
nationaly. 

Grandparents of the girls are 
Mr. and Mrs. Ward Smith of 
Ruidoso, and Mrs. Myrtle 
Osborn of Clovis. 

Grady Newton of Lubbock 
was recently named as head 
basketball coach at Monterey 
High School, Lubbock. 

A 1972 graduate of Monterey, 
Newton then played varsity 
basketball for Texas Tech Red 
Raiders, graduating in 1976. He 
received his Master's Degree 
in English in 1978. He taught at 
Atkins Junior High School until 
the 1982-83 school term when 
he went to Monterey as assis- 

"The first hour of the morning is the rudder of the day." 
H. W. Beecher 

Deborah J. Penner, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Hurshel R. 
Harding of Farwell, was 
among the 166 graduates re-
ceiving the Doctor of Juris-
prudence degree during the 
Texas Tech School of Law 
Hooding Ceremony May 14. 
Deborah was hooded by her 
father who holds a J.D. degree 
from Baylor. 

While in law school, Deborah 
was a member of the Legal 
Research Board serving in the 
capacities of writer and editing 
director. She was also a mem-
ber of Phi Alpha Delta Law 
Fraternity and president of the 
Sam Rayburn chapter. During 
the recent Honors and Awards 
Day, she received the James 
R. Alexander Award for the 
outstanding active member. 

Deborah graduated from 
Farwell High School in 1973 
and received her B.S. degree 
from Baylor University in 1976. 
Deborah and her husband 
Kevin live in Lubbock. 

In Canyon.  

Mrs. Gracie Dane of Texico 
spent Mother's Day with her 
sons, Howard and Bill Hudson 
and their families in Canyon. 

She traveled to Canyon with 
Mr. and Mrs. John Parrish and 
Vera Hudson of Clovis. The 
group spent the weekend visit-
ing, and after attending church 
on Sunday, they returned 
home. 

• 

Ruth Scott of Texico is hos-
pitalized at Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo receiving 
treatment for complications of 
a knee injury. 

Ruth, who is salutatorian of 
the 1983 graduating class at 
Texico High School, will be 
hospitalized approximately 10 
days, accordding to family 
members. Because of the 
medical treatment, Ruth will 
be unable to attend the 
graduation ceremonies. 

She is in Room 441, and 
would appreciate cards and 
calls. 

is found by the union of the 
"T" in the "WT" and an 
extension of the vertical por-
tion of the "T." The status of 
the university is shown in the 
lettering on the rim, said Anita 
Carroll, nursing instructor. 

The rising sun denotes the 
parent institution with upward 
rays and is a symbol of its 
students going forth to help 
mankind, she explained. It is 
reinforced with the Latin motto 
"non nobis solum" or "not to 
ourselves alone." The pin was 
designed by a WTSU student. 

• 

Newton Named Head 

Coach At Monterey 

Newton also teaches the 
Honors English class at Mont-
erey. 

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
J.W. Newton of Lubbock and is 
married to the former Kim 
Snider of Farwell. They have 
one daughter, Lauren. 

tant varsity coach and coach of 
the junior varsity basketball 
team. His JV team record last 
season was 21-0. FARWELL INDEPENDENT SCHOOL 

DISTRICT BUDGET MEETING 

The Board of Trustees of the 

Farwell Independent School 

District will meet on June 6, 

1983, at 8:00 p.m. in the 

superintendent's office for the 

purpose of adopting a budget 

for the 1983-84 fiscal year. 

Janell Garrett, a Farwell 
nursing degree candidate at 
West Texas State University, is 
one of 106 students who 
received a pin during the 
annual senior pinning cere-
mony. 

Miss Garrett is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Phil Garrett of 
Farwell, and is a 1979 graduate 
of Farwell High School. 

Dr. Charlotte Rappsilber, 
dean of the School of Nursing; 
Joan Hodge, instructor; and 
Virginia Sicola, assistant pro-
fessor; conducted the pinning. 

The pin represents the com-
pletion of degree requirements 
for nursing students. The WT 
initials on the pin are on a 
circular background repre-
senting the world. A cross sig-
nifying God and His associa-
tion with nursing and healing 
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Farwell graduating senior 
Jennifer Williams was honoree 
at a luncheon at a Clovis 
restaurant Saturday, May 14. 
The social was hosted by her 
godmother, Jo Wood of Mule-
shoe. 

A graduation theme was 
carried out in the napkins, 
place markers, and flowers on 
the table. 

Others attending were Jen-
nifer's mother, Dolores Wil-
liams, grandmothers, Mrs. 
Vance Wagnon and Mrs. Rex 
Williams, both of Muleshoe, 
and two aunts, Jo Mayhugh of 
Muleshoe and Sonnie Mason of 
Lubbock. 

APRIL COFFMAN 

RECREATION TIPS 

Going out does not necessar-
ily require big bucks, says a 

_New Mexico State University.  
Extension family finance spe-
cialist. Try going to movies at 
times when the theater offers 
reduced rates. Use parks and 
campgrounds for inexpensive 
outings. 

Take advantage of recreaion 
opportunities offered at no 
chargé through your church. 
Check books out of local 
libraries or read magazines 
there. Get involved in local 
athletic groups. 

1 

4 

4 

RED SEZ r 

.44 • 4[4 a.' 

likes 
NEW SHIPMENT 

* Bedding Plants 
* Hanging Baskets 

* Rose Bushes 
Fruits & Vegetables 

PLAYORAMA 

FRUIT MARKET 
482.9521 

TEXICO, N.M. 

LINDSAY LEWIS 

Celebrates 

1st Birthday 

Lindsay Lewis, daughter of 
Bill and Caroline Lewis of 
Farwell, celebrated her first 
birthday Friday, May 6, with a 
birthday party for family and 
friends at the home of her 
parents. 

A Mickey Mouse theme was 
featured in the decorations, 
plates, tablecloth and napkins, 
while a circus theme decorated 
the birthday cake. 

Cake and punch were served 
to the honoree and her guests. 

Attending were the honoree, 
her parents, her sister Mere-
dith, maternal grandparents 
Bob and Carrie Anderson, her 
uncle, Will Anderson and 
friend Carol Norton of Eng-
land; 

Also, Tom, Terri, Jourdan 
and Logan Nichols, and Gaye, 
Shiloh, and Shane Roberts. 

Jack Rose 

Gets Degree 
John "Jack" Rose, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Rose, Jr., 
of Farwell, received his Bach-
elor of Science, Pharmacy, 
degree from Southwestern 
Oklahoma State University in 
Weatherford, Okla., during 
graduation ceremonies May 13. 

Jack, a 1979 graduate of St. 
Paul's High School and College 
in Concordia, Mo., attended 
Farwell Schools until 1978. He 
will be employed by the hos-
pital in Clinton, Okla. His wife, 
the former Linda Dyer of 
Clovis, is an accountant in 
Weatherford. 

Speaker for the graduation 
was Dr. James D. Sill, Profes-
sor Emeritus from Southwest-
ern.

, 
 There were 59 spring 

graduates. 
Attending the commence-

ment were Claude, Pat, and 
Teresa Rose of Farwell; also 
Jack's grandparents, Claude 
Rose, Sr., of Ruidoso, and Mr. 
and Mrs. E.L. Stephenson of 
Ft. Worth, and his parents-in-
law, Mr. and Mrs. Travis Dyer 
of Clovis. 
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Megan Johnson, Parents 

Are Honored At Shower 

Extension Service Explains 

Home Canning Safety Changes 
along with a floral motif. 
Individuals then each brought 
a special toy for the chest. 

Following the evening meal, 
homemade ice cream was 
enjoyed. Attending were Doyle, 
Susan and Megan Johnson, 
Charles and Margaret Aycock, 
Donald and Dot Christian, 
Troy and Lillie Christian, Ed 
and Gwen Corn, Robin Greg-
ory, Jerry and Altha Hering-
ton, Tom and Terri Nichols, 
Rosa Roberts, Mark and Joyce 
Williams, Bert and LaMoin 
Williams, Vick and Denise 
Christian, and Kim Norton. 

Doyle and Susan Johnson 
and infant daughter Megan 
were honorees at a recent 
shower and supper at the home 
of Mark and Joyce Williams. 
Co-hosting the event with Mrs. 
Williams on Thursday, May 12, 
were Gwen Corn, Robin Greg-
ory, and Altha Herington. 

Megan was presented a pew-
ter cup engraved with her 
name and birth date from 
Theta Rho chapter of ESA, and 
members went together to give 
her a toy chest on which Robin 
Gregory had painted her name 

COLLEGE STATION—The 
United States Department of 
Agriculture this week released 
new processing recommenda-
tions for tomatoes and tomato 
juice, applesauce, fruit purees, 
and pumpkin. 

To prevent food-borne illness 
and the loss of valuable home 
canned foods, specialists with 
the Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service are urging home 
canners to follow the new 
USDA guidelines. 

The USDA now recommends 
the following: 

'The one-step, cold pack 
method for canning tomatoes 
should no longer be used. 

'The hot pack processing 
time for canning tomatoes 
should be increased to 35 min-
utes for pint jars and No, 2 
cans, and to 45 minutes for 
quart jars and No. 21/2  cans. 

'The hot pack processing 
time for canning tomato juice 
should be increased to 35 min-
utes for pint and quart jars, 
and for No. 2 and No. 21/2  cans. 

'Strained (pureed) pumpkin 
and winter squash should not 
be canned at home. Instead, 
cubed pumpkin and squash 
may be canned using a proces-
sing time of 55 minutes for pint 
jars and 90 minutes for quart 

jars. 
'The processing times for 

applesauce and fruit puree 
should be increased to 20 min-
utes for pints, quarts, No. 2 
and No. 21/2  cans. 

According to Marilyn Hag-
gard, a foods and nutrition 
specialist with the Extension 
Service, the changes in can-
ning recommendations are 
based on research conducted 
at land-grant universities and 
Research Center of the USDA. 

"The recommendation to 
more than triple hot-pack pro-
cessing times for tomatoes was 
based on research which indi-
cated that shorter times could 
be insufficient under certain 
conditions," says Haggard. 
Insufficient processing could 
allow botulism organisms to 
survive the heat treatment, 
grow and produce harmful 
toxins, she explained. 

a Methodists Set Program 

On Drug, Alcohol Abuse 
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Barnes of 

Lazbuddie will be honored at a 
reception Sunday afternoon, 
May 22, from 3 to 5 p.m. CDT 
in the Lazbuddie School cafe-
teria. 

Mr. and Mrs. Barnes are 
retiring after 18 years with the 
Lazbuddie school system. He 

June Wedding Planned 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin A. [Buck] Kos of Clovis announce 

the engagement and approaching marriage of their daugh-
ter, Debbie Sue, to Lynn J. McDaniel of Texico. He is the 
son of the late Lanelda and Lester McDaniel, and the 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Willie Wall of Texico. 

The bride-elect is a 1983 graduate of Clovis High School 
and is employed by a Clovis dress shop. The prospective 
bridegroom is a 1979 graduate of Texico High School and 
farms near Texico. 

Wedding vows will be exchanged Saturday, June 4, at 7:30 
p.m. MDT at Sacred Heart Church at 911 Merriwether in 
Clovis. A reception following the ceremony will be held at 
the First Federal building on Pile Street in Clovis. No local 
invitations are being sent, but all friends and relatives are 
invited to the ceremony and reception. 

has served as superintendent 
and she has taught in the ele-
mentary grades. They came to 
Lazbuddie in 1965 from Dumas. 

Everyone is cordially invited 
to the reception, and more in-
formation may be had by 
calling 806/965.2828 or 806/-
965-2958. 

Graduates At 

Panhandle State 

Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church will be 
having a special "Faith-Meets-
Life" program Sunday, May 
22, during the morning Sunday 

ID School and worship services. 
The special emphasis is 

being sponsored by the Young 
Adult Sunday Class, and will 
be dealing with drug and 
alcohol concerns. This is es-
pecially for older children, 
youth, and young adults, but 
all are invited, says Don 
Holladay, church pastor. 

"Faith-Meets-Life" Sunday 
• will begin with a special com-

bined Sunday School class for 
older elementary students 
through adults. They will be 
dealing with the issue of 
"drugs and alcohol in our 

lives," Holladay said. 
Tom Woodruff will be the 

guest speaker during the wor-
ship hour at 11 A.M. He is a 
musician in Lubbock, involved 
in all aspects of the music 
world. He is also a converted 
Christian, who has been in-
volved in the drug scene on 
both sides of the fence. 

"He will share a very 
personal witness, as well as 
give a better chance to learn 
more about the choices involv-
ed in growing up in a world 
where drugs and alcohol abuse 
are so prevalent," the pastor 
says. 

Everyone is invited to both 
of these special events begin-
ning at 10 a.m. Sunday, May 
22. 

GREGG TAYLOR 
SCOTT TAYLOR 

have on hand, how to 
select and prepare the 
fruit, how to work with 
pectins, how to process the 
jam, even how to fill and 
seal the jars, plus a list of 
solutions to common prob-
lems. 

You'll find 43 recipes to 
inspire you — jams, jellies, 
no-cook recipes, candies, 
conserves, marmalades —
you name it! And, if that's 

-
not enough,  this handy 
giiideeiidSsai idea's on'' 

',decorating jars to create 
eye-catching as well as 
mouth-watering gifts for 
family and friends. 

Information on ordering 
the booklet at a cost of 
$1.00 per copy is given 
inside packages of Certo 
and Sure-Jell fruit pectin 
sold in supermarkets and 
grocery stores. "Jam and 
Jelly Time" is guaranteed 
to delight and inspire 
present and prospective 
jelly makers alike. 

Taylor Twins 

Have Birthday 
Gregg and Scott Taylor, twin 

sons of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Taylor of Roswell, N.M., 
celebrated their first birthday 
Tuesday, May 17. 

They have a brother, Kevan, 
and a sister, Kimberly. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. J.V. Stancell of 
West Camp, and paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
F.N. Taylor of Ovalo, Tex. 

Jennifer 

Williams 

Honored 

• 
• 
• 

Bettie Martin of Texico 
recently received an award 
during the 21st Eastern New 
Mexico University Annual 
Honors Assembly. The recip-
ient of the Paul Malott Schol-
arship, Mrs. Martin was 
among the more than 200 stu-
dents who received recognition 
for their academic achieve-
ment. 

`Godspell' Is Com ing 
The Celebration Singers of St. "Godspell," which tells par-
Stephen United Methodist ables from the Gospel of Mat-
Church of Mesquite, Tex., will thew. It is a musical drama 
be performing in concert at with each cast member having 
Hamlin Memorial United both speaking and singing 
Methodist Church in Farwell parts in the story of the life of 
Friday, June 3, at 8 p.m. CDT. Christ. Everyone is cordially 
The group, composed of 35 invited. 
youth, will be presenting 

New Sportswear Items 
For Men, Women, and 
Children Arriving Daily. 

The tulip 
tral Asia 
from the 
turban. 

originated in Cen- 
and gets its name 
Turkish word for 

Suggested 	 $999 
Price '24.50 	  

• 

• 

'Desk Lamps Or Clip On Lamps 

If you're looking for a 
source that will tell you 
what you need to know 
about jams and jellies, 
look no further. "Jam and 
Jelly Time" is a booklet 
you'll want to add to your 
recipe library, whether 
you're a beginner or an 
expert in the kitchen, say 
officials at General Foods 
Consumer Center. 

Certo and Sure-Jell fruit 
pectins are featured in a 
Variety of easy no-cook 
jams and jellies as well as 
traditional recipes which 
include conserves, marm-
alades, preserves, and 
relishes. 

There are just a few 
simple basics that a suc-
cessful jelly maker needs 
to know. And it's all here 
in a 32-page booklet with 
how-to information, tips 
and recipes to make it all 
easy for you. First of all, 
there's a checklist of the 
basics -- equipment to 

Newest Guide: 

`Jam And Jelly Time' 

Receives 
Award 

Patrick Henry not only 
helped draw up Virginia's 
first state constitution but 
was elected the state's first 
governor. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Barnes 

Will Be Honored Sunday 

S.O.S. Outlet 

April Coffman, daughter of 
Joyce and Weedy Coffman of 
Farwell, graduated from Pan-
handle State University in 
Goodwell, Okla., Sunday, May 
8. 

April received her BS degree 
magna cum laude, with a 
grade point average of 3.9 in 
physical education with a 
minor in history. 

Attending the graduation 
ceremonies were Alice Autrey, 
Jeanie and Megan from 
Grants, N.M.; Melody Drake, 
Friona; Sharon Gallon and 
Kim from Alva, Okla.; Billy, 
Gaye, Shiloh, and Shane 
Roberts, and Joyce and Weedy 
Coffman, all of Farwell; and 
Hob, Cheryl, Darren, Laura, 
Justin, and Clint Coffman from 
Amarillo. 

April returned to Farwell on 
Friday bringing 'Greg King of 
Guymon, Okla., with her for a 
weekend visit. 

Also receiving a diploma this 
month was another daughter of 
Weedy and Joyce, Alice Aut-
rey, who received her GED 
diploma in exercises on Wed-
nesday, May 11, in Grants, 
N.M. Joyce Coffman was in 
attendance there for the grad-
uation ceremonies. 

Soft Side Samsonite 

Jewelry & Accessories If one has to submit, it is wasteful not to do so with the 
best grace possible." 	 Winston Churchill 

	• 
Long-term credit 
coupled with 
sound planning. 

Assorted Colors 

Stick Up Clocks 
6 Piece 

Screwdriver Sets 
s 99 '5.99 	 $ 1 99 

Value 	  

Large Assortment Of 

'10 	(Fri., Sot., & 
Value Sun. Only) 	 

Designer Colors Ll'Lcus Take Along 

Cuspidor 
'12 Value 	 299  

Tire Guages 

When you make the land your life . . . you 
need good records for sound planning. And 
at your Federal Land Bank Association 
matching long-term credit to long-range goals 
often begins with a look at a customers 
records. Accurate records are usually 
a good indication of The  
how you're doing 
and how you might Land 
do more. 

Reg. 	 $ 1 49 
'2.99 	  

Luggage 

3995  

Surplus 
Overruns & 
Seconds 

'4" '15 Value 

Bank LAND BANK 
cAtorrmion 

Close to the land 
and the people who work it 

Levi Bendover 

Blazers 
Additional Sizes 

Waist Sizes 27 & 28 Sasson 

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 
Bill Liles, Manager 

Just in 	 $2999  

812 Ave. A - Farwell 
Tues.-Fri. Noon to 7 

Sat. 10.7 Sun. 1.5 CDT 

300 Commercial - Portalos 

Daily 10.8 Sun. 1.5 MDT 
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RIP'S 
WESTERN WEAR 

ROSE DRUG EALY FURNITURE 
Clovis 

CURTIS SMITH 
OFFICE SUPPLY 

Farwell 	Xerox Agent 

TURNER'S 
DEPARTMENT 

STORE 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON 
ELEVATOR 

Lariat, Texas 

BURGER BARN 
DRIVE INN 

FIRST FEDERAL 
Savings & Loan Association 

Clovis - Portales 

CITIZENS BANK 
Texico Branch 

CITY CLEANERS 
TWIN CITIES 

MACHINE WORKS 
HUGHES 

 Allialue. 
SHERLEY- 

ANDERSON- 
PITMAN 

KELLY GREEN 
SEEDS 

— 

FARWELL 
HARDWARE 

FRANSE 
IRRIGATION INC. 

"ijj 	
MOBILE 
HOMES 

INC. 

LOVELACE OIL CO.'s  
Texaco Products 

LEE'S ELECTRIC 
GOLDEN WEST 

MILL & ELEVATOR 

WORLEY MILLS 
INC. 

TEXICO FIREBOYS CAPITOL FOODS 
PLAINS 

 EQUIPMENT CO. 

LUCE'S SPUR 
RESTAURANT 

TIDE PRODUCTS 
CASE POWER & 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

Clovis 

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL HOW 	, 
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THE BEAUTY BOX 

SECURITY STATE 
BANK 

MIDWEST VIDEO 
CORP. 

WORLEY MILLS 
INC. 

TIDE PRODUCTS 

TRI COUNTY TIRE 
Farwell 

FARWELL 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
ENMR 

TELEPHONE 
COOPERATIVE 

BURN'S  
BURGER BARN 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON 
PITMAN INC. 

LOOMIX 
LIQUID FEED 

Farwell 

WOOLEY 
INTERNATIONAL INC. 

Muleshoe 

AVON PRODUCTS 
Annette Black 

CAPITOL FOODS ROSE DRUG 
A - Z SERVICE 

Farwell 

KARL'S 
AUTO CLINIC OFFICE 

LUNSFORD 
AUTO PARTS 

CURTIS SMITH 
SUPPLY 

Farwell 	Xerox Agent 

C & T FERTILIZER 
Clovis - Farwell 

OKLAHOMA LANE 
FARM SUPPLY 

GENERAL
USS  

WINDOW CO. 
SIDING 

CUSTOM STORM WINDOWS 
Farwell 

CAL JORDAN 
IMPLEMENTS 

East Mabry Drive 

' 
LEE 

one 
  ELLA DUNBAR 

Ph 	806/272.4663 

ee's w"TE:E"AR. INC. 	• 
I 	1910 W American Blvd. MULESHOE, TEXAS 79347 

PLAYORAMA 
FRUIT MARKET 
GIFTORAMA 

FARWELL 
AUTOMOTIVE 

Tom Lindop 

FARMERS COOP 
ELEVATOR 

Muleshoe 

BAILEY COUNTY 
ELECTRIC COOP 

Muleshoe 

FARWELL 
FERTILIZER 

Dairy 
Queen . 

LUCE'S SPUR 
RESTAURANT 

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY 
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111111  Elementary. Band Award 
saul 

Members of the Farwell Cadet 
Band participated in the 
Levelland Band Festival Sat-
urday, May 14, receiving good 
comments throughout the crit- 

icism. The Cadet Band receiv-
ed a H division in concert and 
a I division in sight-reading. 
Band members shown are 
from left, front: Kristi Ste- 

phens, Tony Nicolas, Jeffery 
Stewart; back row: Angie 
Charlson, Matt Geuther, Don-
ald Rubio, and Kendra Ste-
phens. 

Farwell Elementary Band re-
ceived a I division in concert 
and a II division in sight-read-
ing in competition at the 
Levelland Band Festival Sat- 

urday, May 14. The students 
received good comments 
throughout the criticism sheets 
for their performance, said 
band director Lynn Burton. 

Band members shown are. 
from left, Angie White, Dana 
Ralston. Steve Routon, Chris 
Aycock. and Bruce White. 

Cadet Band Award 

little League Results 

--SUPERSTATION 
WTBS 

Who Brings You Total Entertainment 

14 Hours A Day? 

We Do - With A Little Help 

From Satcom 111 

Midwest Video 
600 Main - Clovis - Ph. 163-4411 

1983 CAVALIER ST. NO. 4651 

TINTED GLASS, SPORT MIRRORS, STABILIZER BAR, FUEL INJECTED ENGINE, 4 
SPEED TRANSMISSION, WHITE WALL TIRES, TAO & GAUGES, AM FM RADIO, 
CLOTH BUCKETS. 

SELLING PRICE 
DOWN PAYMENT 
FINANCED 

7257.00 $1669 
48 PAYMENTS 166.93 
PER MONTH 
TOTAL PAYMENTS 
8007.84 
9.9% A.P.R. 
TO APPROVED CREDIT. 

900.00 
8357.00 

1983 CHEVETTE SCOOTER 
4 SPEED. AM RADIO 

SELLING PRICE 
DOWN PAYMENT 

6489.00 
700.00  

4749.00 $1246.! 
4 PAYMENTS 
174.63 PER MONTH 
TOTAL PAYMENTS 
5982.24 
9.9% A.P.R. 
TO APPROVED CREDIT .  

9.92„. 	99  GALLOJII.A,Sair ET  
OF 

GAS1 99 GALLONS Of GAS WITH 
MR NEW 1982 OR 83 MIICIASEDI 
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IRRIGATION 
INC. / 

Tired of dragging water hoses? 

See us for complete sales, 
design and installation of 

Automatic Lawn Sprinkler Systems. 

Many different brands of 
sprinklers to choose from. 

For the do it yourselfers 
assistance and material available. 

Phone (806) 481-3316 

P.O. Box 99 
Farwell, Texas 79325 

/61  FRANSE 

ri 

DOC STEWART AL JOLLY CH`JCK SLUDER 80685 JACK STEWART 

DON'T HESITATE 
FINANCING 

THESE TERRIFIC FINANCING RATES 
COUPLED WITH DOC STEWART CO.': 

CHOOSE ANY OF THE FOLLOWING CARS AND PICKUPS: CAMAROS, CELEBRITYS, MALIBUS, 
MONTE CARLOS, CAPRICES, CENTURIES, REGALS, LE SABRES, ELECTRAS, RIVIERAS AND OUR 

I I 	A.P.R. 011 
ENTIRE COMMERCIAL LINE AND GET . . . 17 n°/6

* 36 MO. OR 
 

FINANCING 

JIM JACKSON 	 DAN HALL Y DICK AINSWORTH DON TINSLEY GENE Hun-o MAK KELSO BOB GAMBLE 

DOC STEWART CHEVROLET BUICK INC. 
2500 MABRY DR. 763-4465 

* OMR GOCO O.i ALL PrEw 1962.1 l Ilan DM MAY MST. 1963 AND On ORDERS PLACED 09110 APOUL Javan 
99% APR 0000 ON SAYLARAI 41ThArk1 CAVALERT. CITATION*. CHerETTES MO I* 11:31119% 

** pert* pot MAT 13. 1963 

70ippiptg4 

12.9 ON 42 & 48 MO. DON'T WAIT 

HUGE DISCOUNTS WILL PUT YOU IN THE CAR OF YOUR DREAMS TODAY! 

CIOUIAL la0l0t1 coirominam 

GM QUALITY 
SERVICE  PARTS  

0000411000000000000000000004141000,0041004100011410041100410041100000110004141140404114041111011100000000041141411•••• 

Farwell Second In 

District UIL Finish 

Mesman Competes 

In ENMU Track 
Johanna Mesman, a 1982 

graduate of Farwell High 
School, has just completed her 
freshman track season at 
Eastern New Mexico Univer-
sity where she was a member 
of ENMU Zias. 

According to ENMU Coach 
Scott, "Johanna had a very 
successful season. She had an 
ankle injury, but came back 
and was able to do very well." 

Johanna competed in one 
indoor meet and three outdoor 

Texico-Farwell JCCAs are 
planning to sponsor a drive for 
blood donations on Flag Day, 
June 14, from 4 to 9 p.m. CDT. 

Donations will be taken at 

Investing in small 

firms brings 

greater stock returns 
COLLEGE STATION — lo-

‘esting in small firms whose 
outstanding shares seldom 
change hands could bring great-
er stock market returns than 
investing in the so-called "blue 
chips,-  says a Texas A&NI Uni-
versity finance professor. 

-There's some evidence that 
this might be the case, although 
when you invest in the smaller 
firm you're usually taking more 
risk.-  said Dr. S. Kerry Cooper 
of Texas A& NI 's College of Busi-
ness Administration.  

meets with the following re-
sults: 

University of New Mexico 
Open (indoor): 1500 meters, 
5:50, and 3000 meters, 12:45. 

Panhandle State Invitation-
al: 4th, 1500 meters; 3rd, 3000 
meters; and 2nd, mile relay. 

Angelo State Invitational: 
7th, 3000 meters; 5000 meters 
22:33. 

Eastern New Mexico Invita-
tional: 3rd, 3000 meters; 3rd, 
mile relay; and 5th, 1500 
meters. 

the Jaycee Building in Farwell 
during those hours, and all 
area resident who are eligible 
to be blood donors are urged to 
participate in the drive. 

In other business at the 
organization's Tuesday night 
meeting, further plans for the 
upcoming AJRA Rodeo sched-
uled during the BTD celebra-
tion were discussed. 

Next meeting of the JCCAs 
will be Tuesday, June 7, at 8 
p.m. CDT in the Jaycee Build-
ing. All members are encour-
aged to be present. 

Assembly Set 

At Farwell 

Jr. High 
Farwell Junior High students 

will be honored in an awards 
assembly Wednesday, May 25, 
beginning at 10:30 a.m. in the 
school auditorium. 

Scheduled for presentation 
are academic awards, sports 
awards, and cheerleading 
awards. 

Jerry Dee Owen, junior high 
principal, will be officiating at 
the assembly to which all par-
ents and friends are invited. 

Following the awards as-
sembly, the students will have 
their annual play day. 

4"s -4-fg  
President Harry Truman was 
distantly related to Presi-
dent John Tyler. 

A break-down of Farwell's 
scoring included: individual 
awards in one-act play 3; boys 
golf 30; girls golf 50; literary 
events 98; girls tennis 15; boys 
tennis 20; and boys track, 
7. 

Finishing behind Olton and 
Farwell in the district were 
Bovina, 177; Springlake-Earth, 
171; Kress, 143; and Hart, 98. • 

High School Principal Don 
Malone said that even though 
Olton won first place, the stu-
dents at Farwell were to be 
commended for their efforts. 
"We are proud of them," he 
said. 

Farwell High School wound 
up in second place in the 
overall standings in the Dis-
trict UIL competition and 
relinquished the trophy which 
had been at Farwell for the 
past three years, to Olton High 
School. 

Students from (3lton amassed 
a total of 245 points to take the 
overall first ahead of Farwell 
who had 223 points. 

Points from literary, aca-
demic, and athletic events are 
totaled, with the top school in 
the district being awarded a 
traveling trophy. 

[Editor's Note: Coaches of 
all the baseball teams are 
responsible for reporting the 
scores and statistics for their 
team in each week's games to 
the Tribune for publication. 
Reports should be turned in on 
Tuesdays if at all possible.] 

Tide Products defeated Far-
well Insurance 10-8 Monday, 
May 16. 

Pitching for Farwell Insur-
ance were Preston Hubby, 
Tony Nicolas, and Jeff Actkin-
son. 

Scoring runs for Farwell In-
surance were Jeff Actkinson 3, 
Ruben Ortega 2, and Wayne 
Pierson, Jeremy Jones, and 
Jennifer Williams, 1 each. 

Getting hits for Farwell 
Insurance were Jeff Actkinson, 

Ruben Ortega, Jeremy Jones, 
Adrian Nicolas, Riley Malone, 
Tony Nicolas, Greg Actkinson, 
Preston Hubby, and Jennifer 
Williams. 

The Farwell Insurance team 
is coached by Donald Jones 
and Don Malone. 

No statistics were available 
from the Tide Products team 
coached by Randy Kelley. 

JCCAs Sponsoring 

Blood Drive Soon 

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

"When Understanding Is Needed Most" 

Prince & Manana-Clovis-Ph. 763-5541 

YOU LIKED IT - 
OW! firOAWGAFIRNEI  DOING 

• 

41' 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

LIKE BIG CARS?????? 
WELL YOU HAD BETTER HURRY - THE 1984 BUICK PARK AVENUES 

WILL BE 22 INCHES SHORTER. 800 LBS. LIGHTER AND 

ONLY HAVE Y-6 ENGINES 
PLUS 

TAKE ADVANTAGE OF OUR GREAT STOCK OF 1983's CURRENTLY ON HAND AS GM HAS JUST 
ANNOUNCED A 5300.00 INCREASE ON FUTURE 1983's SHIPPED! 

1. 



Signs With has ' 

ttai toot 

"Firestone 
TRE FIELD 

FARM TIRE SERVICE 

Jr. High Award Winners 

Gymnasts To Perform 

23° Radial for less 
slippage and more 

tread life 
Tirestone RADIAL 23°" 

New tractor rear has radial body plies plus 
four rayon stabilizer belts. Compared to 
our bias ply tractor tires. the Radial 23 
gives you: 

• More horsepower 
transfer to the 
ground 

• Less slippage 
• Longer tread 
life 

$580 
18.4R38 

6 Ply Rating 

Plus 16.22 

Fed Ex Tax 

23° bar angle for 
super traction! 

'Firestone 23° FIELD 
AND ROAD 

A replacement tire to compare in 
performance with many higher, priced 
tires. Features our 
famous 23 bar 
angle tread. 

'340 
18.4-38 

6 Ply 
Plus 12.37 

Fed Ex Tax 

fork 
491°P 

Infants and 
Maternity 

Wear 
1312 Main 763-7145 

CLOVIS 

SHOPPING 
DIRECTORY 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM — - 

LARGE SELECTION 

PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

O.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

• 

617 Main 

(Under New Management) 

3800 Mabry Dr. 
Ph. 762-6485 

Lounge Open Daily At 10 a.m. 
Closed Sunday 

Watch 
Wine 

Thurs. Paper For Our 

Of the Week Special 

• LARGEST LINE OF 
IMPORTED WINES 

• LARGEST LINE OF 
IMPORTED BEER 

.•••••••••••••••01•10•11•605  i,  
COLD KEGS TO GO! 

COORS, BUDWEISER. SO-ILITZ 

MICHELOB, MILLER LITE, ■ 
• 
• 

LOWENBRAU (URGE & SMALL).' 

LIQUORS 

Slate Line Tribune, Friday, May 20, 1983 - Page 9 

Jr. High Athletes Honored At Texico 
Tonya Dunsworth and Char- 

t) lie Bibbs were named Best All-
Around Junior High Athletes 
during the Texico Junior High 
Athletic Awards program on 
Thursday, May 12, in Wolver-
ine Gym. 

Kenneth Shaw, principal, 
welcomed the athletes, par-
ents, and guests. Aaron Scott 
gave the invocation, and Kelly 
Lynn led the pledge of alle-
giince to the flag. 

Master of ceremonies for the 
evening was Roger Jesko. 

Coaches Mike Littlejohn and 
Roy King presented the girls 
athletic awards. 

In volleyball, the recipients 
were Twilla Longo, Outstand-
ing -7th grade player; Tracey 
McDonald, outstanding 8th 
grade player; and Carrina 
Hungerford, outstanding 9th 

• grade player. 
Basketball awards went to 

Roller skating was introduced to America by 
James L. Plimpton in 1863. He invented the four 
wheel skate, which worked on rubber pads. 

9th grade football awards. 
In basketball, Bret Taylor 

received the outstanding 7th 
grade player; David Loera, 
outstanding 8th grade player; 
and Mark Meeks, outstanding 
9th grade player. 

Track awards went to Allen 
McCall, outstanding 7th grade; 
Richard Hernandez, outstand-
ing 8th grade; and Jimmy 
Edge, outstanding 9th grade. 

Most Valuable Player a-
wards went to Charlie Bibbs, 
football; Mark Meeks, basket-
ball; and Jimmy Edge, track. 

Kyle Snipes received the 
Best All-Around Sportsmanship 
Boy Athlete award. 

Each athlete received a cer-
tificate for his or her partici-
pation in each individual sport. 

Following the awards pro-
gram, members of the Texico 
Booster Club served refresh-
ments to those attending. 

'Firestone 

FARM 

Twilla Longo, outstanding 7th 
grade player; Michelle Lebow, 
outstanding 8th grade player; 
and Kelly Lynn, outstanding 
9th grade player. 

Those receiving awards in 
track were Twilla Longo, out-
standing 7th grade; Michelle 
Lebow, outstanding 8th grade; 
and ElDonna McCormack, out-
standing 9th grade. 

Most Valuable Players were 
Carinna Hungerford, volley-
ball; Lucia Jesko, basketball; 
and Michelle Lebow, track. 

ElDonna McCormack re-
ceived the Best All-Around 
Sportsmanship Girl Athlete 
award. 

Coaches David Lynn, Little-
john, and King • presented the 
boys athletic awards. 

Outstanding 8th grade foot-
ball player went to David Lo-
era. Stanley Cross and Mark 
Meeks received outstanding 

Lady Wolverine basketball star 
Ruth Scott has signed to play 
basketball with the Eastern 
New Mexico University Zias. 
Present at the signing were 

Ruth was a first team all-state 
choice for four years and was 
twice named the Class A 
Player of the Year. 

her mother, Sue Scott, seated 
left; ENMU head coach Wayne 
Moore, seated right; and 
standing, Roy King, girls bas-
ketball coach at Texico High. 

Ruth Scott Signs With ENIVW Zias 

TIRE & SERVICE 
HEADQUARTERS 

Call us for 
ON-THE-FARM SERVICE 

PORTALES — Head coach 
Wayne Moore of the Eastern 
New Mexico University Zia 
basketball team has announced 
the signing of Ruth Scott, a 6-0 
senior at Texico High School. 

During her high school 
career, Ruth made all-district 
in volleyball twice, and letter-
ed in track for four years. She 

made first team all-state four 
times in basketball, and was 
Class A Player of the Year for 
two years. 

Ruth also made the all-state 
all-tournament team four 
times, made all-tournament 
teams at Texico, Tucumcari, 
Roswell, Floyd and Farwell, 
was the "Amarillo Globe- 

News" Sophomore of the Year, 
and was picked to the South 
All-Star Team in New Mexico. 

She is a member of the 
National Honor Society, salu-
tatorian of her class, and is 
listed among "Who's Who 
Among American Students." 

She is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Orville Scott of 
Texico. 

Jr. High Students Receive Awards • IN-THE-FIELD! •ON-THE-ROAD! •ON-THE-FARM! 
Our fully equipped Firestone farm ser 

	

vicetruck brings you fast on-the-spot tire 	Phone 
repa

W
irs. replac 	and hydroflation 

	

HEN AND
ements  
WHERE YOU NEED IT 	763.4426 

Texico Junior High athletes 
were honored Thursday, May 
12, at a junior high athletic 
awards program. Those re-
ceiving awards included. from 
left, front row: Carrina Hun- 

Mark Meeks, David Loera, 
Bret Taylor, Allan McCall; 
back row': Charlie Bibbs, Kyle 
Snipes, and Jimmy Edge. 
[Texico School Photo] 

gerford, ElDonna McCormack, 
Tracey McDonald, Twilla Lon-
go, Tonya Dunsworth, Michelle 
Lebow, Lucia Jesko, Kelly 
Lynn; middle row: Richard 
Hernandez, Stanley Cross, 

GREAT TIRE BARGAINS 
FOR EVERY FARM 

WHEEL THAT ROLLS! 

6th graders Michael Day and 
Shawn Moore. Shawn also re-
ceived a special medal for his 
science fair project which was 
eligible for state competition. 

Mrs. Brock also presented 
the Outstanding Math awards 
to Robin Pierce, Deborah Har-
ris, Michael Day, Keith Harri-
son, Tim Harmon, and Brette 
Southard. 

She then presented the Spe-
cial Math Contest awards to 
8th graders Brette Southard, 
Tim Harmon, Tammy Mc-
Donald, Nancy Robinson, Dean 
Reid, and Jubal Pierce; and 
7th graders Robin Pierce, 
Debbie Harris, Aaron Scott, 
Twilla Longo, and Jeff Horner. 

Imogene Swinney presented 
the Outstanding Social Studies 
awards to Brette Southard, 
Tim Harmon, David Kendall, 
and Dean Reid, who was 
awarded the American History 
Woodman award. 

Other Outstanding Social 
Studies awards were presented 
by Roy King to Kristi Lovelace 
and Michael Day. 

Mike Littlejohn presented 

Outstanding Social Studies 
awards to Kristi Lovelace and 
Michael Day. 

Kendale Burch presented 
Outstanding Social Studies 
awards in different categories 
to Robin Pierce, civics and 
New Mexico History; Bret 
Taylor, exploratory health ed-
ucation; and Debbie Harris, 
exploratory health education. 

Scott Parker awarded Out-
standing Health and physical 
education honors to Marsha 
McCall, Kristi Preiner, Cory 
McDaniel, and Debbie Harris. 

Urban Orozco received an 
Outstanding Resource Room 
award from Joan Edwards, 
resource room instructor. 

Gina Piazza presented the 
• Outstanding Special Education 
awards to Amado Lopez, Gary 
Cochran, Melissa Lopez, 
Wayne Newcomb, and Patsy 
Moncayo, 

Student Council awards were 
presented by Jesse Orozco, 
Student Council president, to 
Brette Southard, Tim Harmon, 
Patty Cavallero, Aaron Scott, 
Shawn Moore, and June Ortiz. 

Texico gymnastic students will 
be showing their skills and 
talents today [Friday], May 

40 2t, in a program beginning at 7 
p.m. MDT in the Texico old 
gym. A program will be pre-
sented earlier in the day for 

Texico junior high students 
were honored Wednesday, May 
11, in an awards assembly in 
Wolverine Gym. 

Following the pledge of alle-
giance led by Brette Southard, 
and the introduction of the fac-
ulty by Dean Reid and Tim 
Harmon, Kenneth Shaw, high 
school and junior high princi-
pal, presented perfect attend-
ance awards. 

Receiving the attendance 
awards were Terry Allen, Mike 
Williams, Kristi Lovelace, Sar-
ah Cavallero, Judith Gonzales, 
Allen McCall, Buck Autrey, 
Geneva Garcia, Twilla Longo, 
Aaron Scott, Sylvia Estrada, 
Michelle Lebow, Dean Reid, 
and Mary Griffin. 

David Lynn presented Dean 
Reid with the Drivers Educa-
tion Bookwork award. 

Anna Southard presented the 
Language Arts awards to 
Schree Thigpen, Marsha Mc-
Call, Dean Reid, Sylvia Es-
trada, Debbie Harris, Angie 
Maxwell, Shawn Moore, Robin 
Pierce, Brette Southard, Mic-
hael Day, Debbie Harris, Tim 
Harmon, Kristi Lovelace, and 
Twilla Longo. 

Mrs. Southard also presented 
the Outstanding Science a-
wards for the 7th and 8th 
grades. Receiving the awards 
were Twilla Longo, Judith 
Gonzales, Brette Southard, 
Dwayne Hutchinson, Justin 
Barnes, and David Kendall. 

Carol Brock presented the 
Outstanding Science awards to ling. Gymnasts preparing for 

the show are Leslie Cox, top; 
and bottom, from left, Marsha 
Hamilton, Lesley Moore, Rae 
Lynn Autrey, Dara Jenkins. 
and Krystala Cross. 

the school students and others 
who would like to attend at 
1:30 p.m. MDT. Gymnasts, 
under the direction of Paula 
Leighton, will be performing 
on the balance beam, side 
horse, uneven bars, and tumb- The zebra is basically a ligh 

animal with dark stripes. 

THESE VARIETIES 
HAVE PROVEN 
THEMSELVES IN 

coutrrif  
ROTHWELL BODY SHOP 

1814 West 7th [Behind Delmer's Automotive] Clovis, N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 for Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

pom" 
8493 Outstanding Biotype C and E greenbug 

resistance Excellent stalk quality. Developed 
especially for limited moisture conditions. 

8222 Outstanding resistance to the new pathotype 
of downy mildew. Excellent yield potential, 
standability and disease protection. Hard 
seeded, high test weight grain.  

8515 Very high yield potential. Excellent head 
exsertion...easy to combine Adapted to limited 
moisture conditions Baldock & Sons 

Firestone 
1621 N. Prince 	763-4426 

HUDSON UPHOLSTERY 
fr)  GILBERT KALTWASSER 

Farwell, Texas 
PIONEER. 	Ph. 806/825-3953 

We also honor: 
• Visa 

0 	on revolving charge at 
90 DAYS sa:B CASH Custom Upholstery, Slip Covers, Bedspreads 

And Decorator Specialty Items 

Ph. 505/763-4142 

• MasterCard .
firestone stores and many Firestone dealers. 

1325 S. Prince St. • 11/49•Ini Intank or Porn/ m Mod inlemandans. 
Penne Is a bad nitre 'train dinar rates 

The in.4!.0, of Vilanisti ibeid ..'NM OPCM•Aftc a M 111101  is mel ca IM Its. 01 We 
. •.• ,.,um monthly payment required 

• • 	• fiance charges refunded when paid as mit NA Clovis, New Mexico 

a 



Discount 
Furniture 

617 Prince-(505) 769-0887 
Clovis, New Mexico 88101 

Owners 

TAMMY POWELL 
Historian 

Texico 

She has served as Honor 
Society vice-president, and 
won a Speech award, as well 
as serving on the staff of the 
school yearbook. 

Tammy Powell, daughter of 
Rodney Powell, is the class 
historian. 

In basketball, she was 
named to the All-State team, 
EPAC All-Tournament team, 
and Farwell All-Tournament 
team. She was voted most pop-
ular in high school, senior 
class favorite, and has been on 
the honor roll this year. 

RUTH SCOTT 
Salutatorian 

Texico 

English award, and the Nation-
al Math award. 

During her senior year, she 
served as editor of the school 
yearbook. She is active in 
church activities and summer 
youth camp work. 

Ruth Scott, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Keith Scott, is salu-
tatorian. 

She was named Class A 
Player of the year in basket-
ball, First Team All State, and 
All Tournament player in 
Roswell, Farwell and EPAC. 
She was also named All Dis-
trict 1981-82, and All-Around 
Athlete. 

SHARLET TAYLOR 
Valedictorian 

Texico 

Sharlet Taylor, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Taylor of 
Texico, is class valedictorian. 

She has been a member of 
the National Honor Society, 
serving as president this year. 
She is also the president of the 
Medical Careers Club. She has 
been named to Who's Who in 
American High Schools, and 
was a Girls State delegate last 
year. 

In FHA, she has served as 
secretary and president during 
her three years of partici-
pation. She has won the State 
Math award, Physics award, 

—ILL El. CHARRO 
a o 	

MEXICAN 
FOOD 

l.n
.. 

805 E. 1st / Clovis, NM 

Frank & Betty Ann Moscato 
Owners 	 769-1345 

K & W Sheet Metal 
PHONE 762.1222 

EL MONTERREY 
Mexican Food Exclusively 

Since 1934 
118 Mitchell 	Orders To Go 	163-4031 

AIIIIIII. 

4NAPA/ 
CORNER OF SECOND LIDDING 

= Parts For 
Everything 

= That Moves! 

MABRY MOTOR CO. 
110 S HICKORY 

CLOVIS NEW MEMO 

THE VIDEO STOP 
VIDEO MOVIES...HUNDREDS IN STOCK! 

1709 Mabry Drive 	Tel.: 763.7976 

COLS VACCUX CENTER 
Sales & Service On All 

Top Line Vaccum Cleaners 

703 N. Prince - 762-6580 1305 Mabry Drive 
Dance Nightly To 	763-5579 • 

live Country Western 

Entertainment 

dawn creations 
sporting goods 

415 Main i 762-1042 
Clovis, N.Mex. 88101 

Your Complete Video Store 
2909 N. Prince 
City's, New Mexico 88101 

CLOVIS STEAM LAUNDRY 
AND..pRY CLEANERS 

DURHAM & KINYON 
INSURANCE 

Wishes The Texico Graduates The 'Best Of Luck 

From Laurie Kinyon 

f course you can charge  it  

r4S1 
VISA' 
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These Clovis Merchants Offer Congratulations To Our Graduates 
CURRY COUNTY ANIMAL HOSPITAL 

Gene's Truck Center 
The Parts Center Of Clovis 

1401 E. Mabry Dr 505/169-2801 Gene Pershall 

5800 Mabry Drive 
Hwy 70-84 East of Clovis 

Glenn W. Keim, DVM 
Bus. Phone:(5051782-7771 Texico 

High School Ed Goins 
Manor., RADIALS-80 SER 

MAGS-CHROM 
BRAKES•ALIGJ  

ES 
•SHOCKS 

MENT 520 E. 1st Clovis RALPH MADRID TUCK WALKER 

WHOLESALE 
AND 

RETAIL SALES 

600 E. 1st 
CLOVIS N.M. 88101 

lc 9* 

:1:15/tkvis 
Moving Soon to 311 Main 

TRANS-MATIC TRANSMIMIONS 762-1651 
MONTY RUCKER OWNER 

COOK'S TRUCK CENTER 

RESTAURANT 
Clovis, New Mexico 

'a pot4  Sete, 9604  A to 1 Equipment Repair 
Complete line of farm and industrial repair. 

2300 Mabry Dr. - 769-2811 

SUPER 

SUBS & SALADS 

762-7418 

1007 W. 7th 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 

STEVE & JACKIE CARON 

,;) 

tan COlOkliAty 
MENS SHOP 

306 Main St. - Clovis, N.M. 

SUTTON'S BAKERY 
515 Main 
762-0342 

W & J Distributors Rest-Mor Mattresses 

W & J Auction Service 
1009 E. 1st. - 163-1311 

W & J Enterprises Clovis 
GENERAL SHEET METAL - HEATING AND 

AIR CONDITIONING 

A&M FARM & RANCH SUPPLY, INC. 

Class Of 1983 2600 E. Mabry Drive 
Clovis, NM 88101 

505-762-7717 

1601 South Avenue D 
Portales, NM 88130 

505-356-8543 
1302 West American Blvd 

Muleshoe, TX 79347 
806-272-5571 Susan Robinson 

Ruth Scott 

Terri Tatum 

Sharlet Taylor 

Patti Wilson 

Jeannie Chavez 

Bobby Louderback Jackie Burk 

Robert Meier 	Anita Dimas 

Jesse Orozco 	Corinna Hungerford 

Danny Reid 	Teresa Martinez 

Travis Herrington Lynn Tubbs 	Audrey McCauley 

Tammy Powell 

Lynn Robinson 

Billy Askew 

Earl Bibbs 

Jay Duncan 

Allan Hadley 

ALL PARTS SUPPLY , 
atneks OVERNIGHT DELIVERY ON ITEMS NOT IN STOCK 

Complete 
Machin. fie 

Shop 
Service 

"HALL of DIAMONDS" 
FULL SERVICE & REPAIR 

103 W nth BOX 518 TELEPHONE 762 3317 
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 88101 

KAY PATRICK 	 GARY PATRICK 763-5524 

ONE STOP - TOOL SHOP 
Tools For Every Occasion 

Floyd Cline 	1111 Mabry Dr. 	505/162-6592 

e 

Cash For Used Cars 

ELMER COFFEY Cake Phone 762-3111  
H R TRENT On Mngf 	 Res Pho 7620860 Bob Johnson 	Lloyd Williams 

Ricky Lebow 	Tommy Cavallero 
LET US ENTERTAIN YOU 

FARMER'S COOPERATIVE 
ELEVATORS INC. 

Grain 	Fuel 	Feed 	Fertilizer 

Clovis - Grier - Melrose 

THE CLOVIS NEW CAR DEALERS ASSOCIATION 

Chita Peitg9 •Cougg Carmach & S0n3 9#1tc. 
4 m4A's 41.444 taise44 wafting. Was to shop 

314 Main St. 	 Dial 763-7152 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 	88101 

* Bender Olds 	* McGehee Trucks 

* Clovis Honda 	* Rierson Motors 

* "Doc" Stewart Co. * Watson Motor Company 

* Hagelgantz Big Country Ford 

* Jones-Wilkenson Pontiac 

HARBES HOUSE 
OF HALLMARK 

316 Main Street 

Gifts For All Occasion 
Clovis 

Wedding Invitations 

Home Lumber & Supply Co. 
1201 East 1st. St. - Clovis 

Box 280 	 763.4437 

• S.1, 
X igen e vomit 01 

BETT'S AWARD CENTER 
Trophies, Engraving, Embroidering 

* Quality Work 762-7268 * Fast 
Service 

John Betts 	 415 Main, Clovis 

(505) 763-6020 

Local Manufacturers 
Of Trophies 

SALES 
SERVICE 

III INSTALLATION 

Bruce Fellers 
Owner 

Ph (5051 769-2853 

444428 
TROPHIES — GIFTS — AWARDS 

212 MAIN • CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 88101 

Phone 763-5509 

101.105 
Makin Street • Bill • Julie 

CHARGE YOUR NEEDS WITH CHARG-ALL 

	

witiml 	MLS 
MINIM  
1002 N. Prince HERB MOSHIER 

	

CLOVIS NEW MEXICO 61101 	 BROKER 

Office Ph. 505 769-2334 Res. Ph. 763-7953 

FREEMAN,S BRIDAL SHOP 
& WEDDING PHOTOGRAPHY 

Complete Coverage 

510 Main, Clovis 
Bus. 762-0474 Home 162-9113 

Fadg  #ou-Wigui) 
LA RUE JEWELRY & MFG. 

Doyal G. LaRue 

102 W. 5th - Clovis - 763-3354 

Fast 
service? 
You bet! 
114 E. Grand 

(505) 762-7759 
420 Main Sired 763-4451 8:00-5:30 

JCPenne [PEP814111  
ft— 

Na• 
• 

3EICTOLIMUE.  & Mar t;S,  

Stare 
.44 yA BOTTLERS, INC. 

400 N. Prince, Clovis 

-save lor 

5th & Mitchell / Ph. 762-2906 
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 88101 •LIkl 4.4.111/ I.IIII IA, 	 1806 \ Prince 

14414i 744.7,0 	 \ \I MI01 1981 .1 C .trot, Co,n1Olnir (11c 

T 	''Pa..F4444.4"t4o41.1Thii04114EaDaK441145P,...... 	 ' ' 
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These Clovis Merchants Offer Congratulations To Our Graduates 
CURRY * 

Hwy 

Glenn 
Bus. 

COUNTY ANIMAL HOSPITAL 

MOO Mabry Drive 
70-84 East of Clovis 

W. Keim, DVM 
Phone: 150 51 762-7771 

, _.> 
The  Gene'srs 

Center

Truck 
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Pa 	
IecnItoevris  

1401 	E. Mabry Dr 	505/769-2801 	Gene Pershall 

Discount 	„„ • 
Fa rwe I I 

h s  h 	1  
11 

611rpirlinrce.1( 1,50 f)t71619-07 	1""' 
Clovis, New Mexico 88101 

Owners 
TUCK WALKER 	 RALPH MADRID 

- 
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CWAL4-/L07 

RADIALS-60 SER 
MAGS•CHROM 
BRAKES-ALI 
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-SHOCKS 
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Ed Goins 
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Manairr 

..iiii- 
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762-1691 	 106 W. 5th, 
Moving Soon to 311 Main 

Clovis 

600 E. 
CLOVIS N.M. 

1,1111■111 

MONTY 
TRANS-MAT1C 

1st 
68101 

BUCKER 

RETAIL 

OWNER 

WHOLESALE 
AND 

SALES 

...simmer 

an , 1 711  ...-7,..,,uo 

Frank 

EL CHARRO 	MEXICAN 
FOOD 

805 E. 1st / Clovis, NM 

& Betty Ann Muscato 
Owners 	 769-1345 

COOK'S 

Clovis, 

RESTAURANT 

TRUCK 

New Mexico 

CENTER 

POLLY 

Polly Turner, Farwell's 
edictorian, is the 
Mr. 	and 	Mrs. 
Turner, Jr., of Farwell. 

She has won first 
District UIL Poetry 
cation 	contest, 	qualifying 
Regional Poetry 
for the past two years. 

As a member of 
"Rise and Shine," 
among those given 
mention 	in 	the 
One-Act Play competition 
year, and also received 
able mention on 
Cast for district 
her "Ladies of 
role. 

She has been 

Anderson 

Helen Armstrong 

Shana Blain 

Frank Cantu 

Sandra Coates 

Kelly Davis 

Logan Dollar 

Valedictorian 
Farwell 

TURNER 

val. 
daughter of 
Charles 	A. 

place in the 
Interpre- 

for 
competition 

the cast of 
she was 

honorable 
UIL 	District 

last 
honor - 

the 	All-Star 
this year in 
the Tower" 

on the honor 

C 

KELLY DAVIS 
Salutatorian 

Farwell 

roll for the 	past 	four 	years, 	and 
and has participated in band 	ilia. 
for the past four years, win- 	Kelly 
ning the American Musical 	and 
Foundation award two years, 	been 
and was named 	to 	the 	All- 	was 
Region Band three years. She 	was 
was also named to the New 	area 
Mexico Lions Club Band. 	graduation 

	

Polly was selected Border 	served 
Town Days Queen in 1981, and 	has 
has received the Keith Winter 	homecoming 
Scholarship to West 	Texas 	She 
State University. She has been 	band, 
a cheerleader for the 	past 	al Honor 
three years, serving as head 	as class 
cheerleader 	her senior 	year. 	Jennifer 
She has been taking gymnas- 	ter 
tics for the past four years and 	Stancell, 
is currently teaching dance 	give 

lass Of 

Maribel Estrada 	Billy 

Gary Haseloff 	Tammy 

Tim Hughes 	Carlos 

Wade Kent 	Domingo 

Jacqueline Kube 	Carrie 

Rocky Menning 	Irene 

W & 

girls gymnastics 

Davis, 
Mrs. Jerry 

a Girls State 
named an 
teen. During 

as an honor 
been a member 

was active 
Student 

Society, 
president 

Stancell, 
of Mr. and 

has been 
the class 

Myers 

named salutatorian. 

ceremonies, 

court. 

1983 Porta5015e-s3,56-N8M54883  

Pena 

Saldana 

Sanchez 

JENNIFER STANCELL 
Historian 
Farwell 

	

in Boy- 	graduation ceremonies 	this 
year. 

	

daughter of Mr. 	She has been a contestant in 

	

Davis, 	has 	UIL 	Regional 	in 	editorial 

	

She 	writing 	for 	the 	past 	three 

	

delegate, and 	Years. 	She 	has 	received 	the 

	

outstanding 	outstanding area teen award, 

	

last year's 	and 	was 	chosen 	as 	class 

	

she 	favorite for the past two years. 

	

guard, and 	She was a Girls State alter- 

	

of 	the 	nate. 
Jennifer has been a Student 

	

in basketball, 	Council representative for two 

	

Council, Nation- 	years, serving as president this 

	

and served 	year. During her sophomore 
this year. 

	

the dough 	
and junior years, she served as 
vice-president of her class, and 

	

Mrs. Leamon 	was the class secretary-treas- 

	

named to 	urer this year. She has been a 

	

history during 	member of the band for the 
past four years. 

Stephen Schilling 

Obenshain 	Jennifer Stancell 

Brenda Storholt 

Rubio 	Polly Turner 

Sandra White 

Jennifer Williams 

Elva Yruegas 

' 14 	4  
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Mabry 

Equipment 
farm 

Dr. 

and 

- 769-2821 

industrial 

Repair 
repair. -\ 

1007 W. 7th 
/ 	0,67i/ 
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STEVE & JACKIE CARON 	\ 

SUPER 
SUBS & SALADS 

762-7418 

SUTTONS 
515 
761-0342 

Main 
BAKERY teftUlt 

306 Main 

i( 

MEN'S 

Si. - 

C011411, 

SHOP 

Clovis, N.M. 

\I*101 	K & W Sheet Metal 
ti  

PHONE 762-1222 ffrE IN 
V 	u 

GENERAL SHEET METAL • HEATING AND 
AIR CONDITIONING 

W & J Distributors 

1009 

W 8 

E. 	1st 
.1 Auction 

J 	Enterprises 

Rest-Mor 

- 163-1311 

Service 

Clovis 

Mattresses 

A&M FARM & RANCH SUPPLY, INC, 
260001 05Evoi.5s.:Na2birnry881710  Drivei 	1601 South Avenue D 

1C1 

1302 West American Blvd 
Muleshoe, TX 79347 

806-272-5571 

k
.‘ 

i 

118 	Mitchell 

Mexican 
EL 

Orders 

Since 
Food 

To Go 

MONTERREY 

1934 
Exclusively 

763-4031 

ALL PARTS SUPPLY 
/ 

103 W 4th 

KAY PATRICK 

FULL 

CLOVIS, 
BOX 

"HALL 

518 

SERVICE 

NEW 

of 
atnc 

DIAMONDS" 

TELEPHONE 
MEXICO 

&REPAIR 

, 	--1 hs I. 
762 

88101 
GARY PATRICK 

k.o.i.'./e,._ Jay 

3317 

L OVERNIGHT DELIVERY ON ITEMS NOT IN STOCK 	I  

MEM 
= 	Parrs For I N RPiP C°.Ph° 

hr;hing 	 4•1'°7 
 fie 

TaoyoI 	7   Sorrtco 

VIII=I 
CORNER OF SECOND 6 MOOING 	 763-5524 

MABRY MOTOR CO. 
,,os HICKORY 

CLOVIS NEW MEXICO 

Cash For Used Cars 

ELMER COFFEY 	 Office Phone 762 3111 
H R TRENT. Ott Mngr 	 Res Pho 7620860 

Floyd 

ONE 

Cline 

Tools 
STOP 

1117 

For 

Mabry 

- 
Every 

TOOL 

Dr. 

Occasion 
SHOP 

505/762-6592 

LET US ENTERTAIN YOU 

Grain 

FARMER'S 

Clovis 

ELEVATORS 
Fuel 

- Grier 
Feed 

- 

COOPERATIVE 
INC. 

Melrose 
Fertilizer 

THE 	VIDEO STOP 
VIDEO MOVIES...HUNDREDS IN STOCK! 
1709 Mabry Drive 	Tel.: 763-7976 

4 exat's 

314 Main 

CLOVIS, 

Carmach 
41.4441 

St. 

NEW 

wheice 

MEXICO 

_7)  
agtossos 

88 

Sony 
&tee 

Dial 763-7152 

101 

.9mc. 
to ditty:. DIPPet eglai fall 

1305 Mabry Drive 	. 
763-5579 . 

THE 

* 

* 

CLOVIS 

Bender 

Clovis 

Olds 

Honda 

NEW CAR 

* 

*McGehee 

DEALERS 

Rierson 

Trucks 

Motors 

ASSOCIATION CLOVIS %%COM CENTER 
Sales & Service On All 

Top Line Vaccum Cleaners 

703 N. Prince - 762-6580 

Home 
1201 

Box 280 

Lumber 
East 

& Supply 
1st. 	St. 	- Clovis 

763-4437 

Co. 

Gifts  For  All  

OF 
HARBES 

316 

Occasions 

Main 
HALLMARK 

Street 
Wedding Invitations 

Dance Nightly To 
HOUSE * :, "Doc" Stewart Co. 	* Watson Motor Company J 	i . .. .1 	.1  . 

Live Country Western 

Entertainment 

* 	Hagelgantz Big Country Ford 

* Jones-Wilkenson Pontiac 

V 

Your Complete 
2909 N. Prince 
Clovis, New 

I DEO 
IlioNf 

Video 

Mexico 88101 

1111 
Store 	Bruce 

Ph 

SALES 
SERVICE 
INSTALLATION 

Fellers 
Owner 

(505) 789-2853 

r 

Se. urtdifuirei 

R addl",tei 

5 004444 Id 
TROPHIES — 

21 2 	 • 	CLOVIS, 

(505) 	763-6020 

Local Manufacturers 

Of Trophies 

GIFTS — AWARDS 
NEW MEXICO 88101 •

MAIN 

dawn creations . BETT'S 
sporting goods 	 ',A 	e 

415 Main 	I 	762-1042 	 • 	"--, 1 

Clovis. N Mex 88101 	
J 

-- • 	...4; 
st......&- 

• Bill 	• 	Julie 

Trophies, 

* Quality 
John 

AWARD 
Engraving, 

Work 
Betts 

162-7268 
Embroidering 
CENTER 

*Fast 

415 Main, 
Service 

Clovis 

CLOVIS STEAM LAUNDRY 
AND DRY CLEANERS 

Phone 763.5509 
101-103 

Me111 Street 

MU 

Mgt Illt 

it  
CHARGE YOUR NEEDS WITH CHARG-ALL 

Fast 
service? 	moNTGomERY 

III 
You bet! 	A m 
114 E. Grand 	 8:00-5:30 7634451 

LA RUE 
Do al 	G. 

JEWELRY 
LaRue 

& MFG. Fad, 	Aim• 
Nou-7 ue 

a 

FREEMAN,S BRIDAL SHOP 
& WEDDING PHOTOGRAPHY 

Complete Coverage 
1902 N. Prince HERB MOSHIER 

102 W. 5th - Clovis - 763-3354 
420 

(505) 762-7759 
Main _Sr.,/ 	 etwii, 

510 Main, Clovis 
Bus. 762-0474 	Home 762-9173 

CLOVIS NEW NIEXiC0 

Office Ph. 

16101 

505,769-2334 

BROKER 

Res. Ph. 763-7953 jcpenney  ft.  ..---- ,a, 	,,., 
We Hove True Values Every Day 

- 	 (Lir 

Alicroinnue & Alorer 

Prepared By 

Al's Advertising Agency 
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"' 
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5th & Mitchell / Ph. 762-2906 
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I Courthouse 
Notes 

Instrument report ending 
May 11, 1983, in the county 
clerk office, Bonnie Warren, 
County Clerk. 

WD - Frio Development Co., 
Inc. - W.B. Fulgham - Pt. Blk. 
2 & Pt. Blk. 3, Western Add. 
Friona. 

WD - Marion F. Fite, Jr. -
Thomas M. Beauchamp - NW 
1/4  Sec. 13, T6S; R3E. WILL BUY GOOD used film': 

ture and appliances. Haney's 
Swap Shop, Farwell, Tex. 
481-9511. 	 48-tine 

Professional 
Lawn Care 

Mowing, Edging, 
Hedge Trimming, Fertilizing, 

Weed Control, Hauling 

S & S Mowing 
481-3403 	 26-tfnc 

'UTILITY TRAILERS-8x16, 
tandem axle, low boy, with 
lights, 7,000 pounds. $675 each. 
Call 806/744-8993 anytime. 
Kirkland Machine, 510 North 
Ave. H., Amarillo Highway, 
Lubbock, Tex. 	37-2tp 

PORTABLE WELDING 

For your welding needs, call 

Harold Charlson 
ASME Qualified 	825-3901 

35-4tc 

BLUE JEANS--$9.95 pair at 
Haney's Swap Shop, 102 Ave. 
A, Farwell. 	 28-tfnc 

OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sports-
wear, Infant-Preteen or Ladies 
Apparel Store. Offering all 
nationally known brands such 
as Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbilt, Calvin Klein, 
Wrangler, over 200 other 
brands. $7,900 to $24,500 in-
cludes beginning inventory, 
airfare for one to Fashion 
Center, training, fixtures, 
grand opening promotions. Call 
Mr. Loughlin at (612) 888-6555. 

37-ltp 

STERI STEAM 
For cleaner carpeting: 

Thomas Carpet 
Cleaning Service 
238-1640 - Bovina 

TELL OUR ADVERTISERS 
YOU SAW IT 

IN THE TRIBUNE! 

CARD OF THANKS 

We would like to express our 
deepest appreciation for the 
calls, cards, flowers, thoughts, 
prayers, and other acts of 
sympathy shown us in the loss 
of our loved one, Deward M. 
Armstrong. 

Mrs. Betty Armstrong 
Mr. and Mrs. Emmitt Autrey 
Mr. and Mrs. Butch Chumley 
Mr. and Mrs. Terry Armstrong 
Mr. and Mrs. Kent Armstrong 

37-1tp 

CARD OF THANKS 

We would like to express our 
sincere thanks to everyone for 
the flowers, food, cards, calls, 
prayers, and every act of sym-
pathy shown us during the loss 
of our loved one. Your kind-
nesses were greatly apprec-
iated. 

The family of Frank Justice 
37-1tc 

Classified Ads 
Get Results 

I 	CAPITOL FOODS 

CLASSIFIED & LEGAL RATES: 
First insertion, per word - 12c 
Second and additional insertions - 10c 
Minimum charge - $3.00 on cash order 
Card of Thanks - Same as classified word rate 
Legal Notices - Same as classified word rate 

Double rate for blind ads 
Classified Display - $1.75 per col. inch 

MINIMUM BILLING CHARGE $4.00 

Classified Insertion Deadline For 
Friday's State Line Tribune - 10 a.m. Wednesday 

4  P.O. Box 426 
Farwell, Tx. 79325 

1.1.7 
\\ORLEY MILLS INC. 

„LIM a. 

-4WM- 
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Week Of Activities Set 

For Clovis Pioneer Days WHIR& KWKA and Wrangler Country 
Showdown in which individual 
performers and bands will 
provide entertainment. 

Judging of the best chili will 
be at 3 p.m., and all proceeds 
from this year's cookoff will be 
donated to the Lyceum Theater 
restoration project. 

The Little Buckaroo Rodeo 
for entrants 12 years of age 
and under will be May 31 at 4 
p.m. in the Curry County Fair-
grounds arena. 

June 4 will be a big day in 
the celebration, starting with a 
daylight liftoff of the balloons 
here for the fiesta, and the big 
Pioneer Days Parade set to 
kick off at 10 a.m. 

The PRCA rodeo will have 
performances June 2, 3, and 4 
at the fairgrounds arena at 8 
p.m. 

The calendar of other activi-
ties includes: June 1: intro-
duction of ropers; June 2: 
steer roping event at arena at 
10 a.m., and PRCA rodeo; 
June 3: PRCA rodeo, Shrine 
Club Ceremonial; June 4: bal-
loon fiesta launch, Jr. Angus 
show, One Mile Fun Run, 
Pioneer Days Parade, annual 
book sale, 4-H Club barbecue, 
Navy hot air balloon rides, fid-
dlers contest, antique auto 
show, Shrine Club Ceremonial, 
soccer tournament, country 
music fest, and PRCA rodeo 
performance; 

Also, June 5: Balloon fiesta 
launch and soccer tournament. 

An entire week of activities 
is on tap for area residents and 
visitors as Clovis gets set for 
the 13th Annual Pioneer Days 
Celebration and the 4th Annual 
Balloon Fiesta scheduled May 
28 through June 5. 

The events really get started 
Friday, May 27, with the Miss 

Pioneer Days Pageant and 
naming of Miss Pioneer Days 
Rodeo Queen at 7:30 p.m. in 
the Clovis High School Lecture 
Hall, 

Saturday, May 28, will have 
two big events: The third 
annual Pioneer Days Chili 
Cookoff and a new venture, the 

Land Bank Reduces 

WANTED-Posting clerk. Pro-
ficiency on 10-key a must. If 
not, please do not apply. Some 
typing, mostly with figures. 
Must be accurate on both. Paid 
Vacation, group health. Parmer 
County Cattle Company, Hwy. 
60, Bovina, TX., contact Jean-
ette Walling 806/225-4400. 37-tfnc 

HOME REMODELING--Room 
additions, garage conversions, 
doors, windows, paneling, stor-
age houses. Twenty years ex-
perience. Call Winston, 482-9405. 

37-Hp 

WANTED TO BUY--Mobile 
home lot in Texico. Write P.O. 
Box 411, Texico, N.M. 88135. 

37-1tp 

BIG RUMMAGE SALE-May 20 
and 21, 9 to 5. 703 Avenue A, 
Farwell. Farwell Country Club 
Ladies Association. 	37-Itc 

REPOSSESSED SIGN! Noth-
ing Down! Take over pay-
ments $58.00 monthly. 4' x 8' 
flashing arrow sign. New 
bulbs, letters. Hale Signs. Call 
FREE 1-800-626-7446, anytime. 

37-2tp 

Fawn Ckwtek 06 Oudot 
Ralph Gates - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

year," Benson said. On Janu-
ary 1, 1983, the Bank's interest 
rate on farm related loans was 
lowered to 11.25 percent. The 
interest rate for rural resi-
dence and farm-related busi-
ness loans was lowered to 11.75 
percent. Bank closed loan fees 
subsequently were reduced in 
February from 4 to 2 percent 
on farm loans and from 7 to 4 
percent on rural residence and 
farm-related business loans. 
The fee reduction was made 
possible, Benson said, by the 
decrease in the Bank's cost of 
funds. 

The Federal Land Bank As-
sociation of Muleshoe makes 
long-term real estate loans in 
the counties of Bailey and 
Parmer. 

FIRE CALLS 

Farwell Volunteer Fire De-
partment received one call 
since the last report, making a 
run to the Farwell elemen-
tary school building Thursday, 
May 12. Firemen were sum-
moned when a wall switch 
caught on fire in the first 
grade room. Only minor 
damage was done to the 
switch, and no other damage 
was reported. 

Texico Volunteer Fire De-
partment received no calls this 
week. 

r 	 1 
Phone 

481-3681 

To Place Your 

Want Ad 
I 
	

sal 

Interest rates on Land Bank 
variable rate loans will be re-
duced to 11 percent on farm 
loans and to 11.50 percent on 
rural residence and farm-re-
lated business loans effective 
May 1, 1983, said Bill Liles, 
president of the Federal Land 
Bank Association of Muleshoe. 

In addition, the Land Bank 
has reduced its Bank closed 
loan fees to 1 percent on farm 
loans and to 2 percent on rural 
residence and farm-related 
business loans, according to 
Thomas H. Benson, president 
of the Federal Land Balk of 
Texas. These reduced fees are 
effective April 25, 1983. 

"The adjustments follow 
reductions made earlier this 

Variable Rate Loans 

Memorial Day Drivers 

Urged To Use Caution 
TWO MINUTES 

Willi ME BIBLE 
BY CORNELIUS R. SIAM PRIS. 

!IRIAN BIBLE SOCIETY 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60635 

THE FATHER OF BELIEVERS 

Texies 
Finsf Baptist Ckmck 

Joel Horne - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Memorial Day signals the 
end of school and the beginning 
of summer vacations. There 
will be an increase in the num-
ber of vehicles on our streets 
and highways, according to 
Major Vernon Cawthon, Re-
gional Commander of the 
Texas Department of Public 
Safety. 

Cawthon stated, "Countless 
lives would be saved if drivers 
would not disregard their own 
safety and the safety of others. 
Speeding, drinking drivers, 
and carelessness will account 
for the greatest percentage of 
deaths this Memorial Day 
weekend." 

DPS records show that 58 
persons died in traffic acci-
dents on Texas streets and 

I 

highways during the Memorial 
Day weekend last year, and 
the DPS Commander pointed 
out that, "one drinking driver 
or speeding motorist has 
destroyed an entire family." 

Cawthon said, "Holiday or 
vacation trips should be plan-
ned and a rest stop should be 
made every two hours to allow 
drivers and passengers a 
chance to get out and stretch 
to help eliminate stress and 
fatigue." 

Major Cawthon added, "Dri-
vers who think ahead, stay 
alert, wear their seat belt, 
avoid the use of alcohol while 
driving, and obey speed limits 
can have a safe trip and a 
great vacation." 

I 

Foul& 
Rot 13aptialekorit 

Pat Riley - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

"Abraham believed God, 
and it was counted unto him 
for righteousness" (Rom. 
4:3). 

Has it ever occurred to 
you that the most loved, 
the most honored, the most 
respected person of history 
is-not Christ. but Abraham. 
Chrit-odght to be. but Abra-
ham is. Besides the millions 
of professing Christians, 
there are untold other mil-
lions of Jews and Moham-
medans who speak with 
reverence of "our father 
Abraham." 

Clearly this is why God 
used this man to show us 
how to be saved and justi-
fied before a holy God. As 
Paul is God's great example 
of grace, so Abraham is 
God's great example of 
faith-saving faith. 

"If Abraham were justi-
fied by works," says Ro-
mans 4:2, he has something 
to boast about-but not be-
fore God, who sees and 
knows all. But Abraham uns 

justified. How? What saith 
the Scripture? "Abraham 
believed God and IT WAS 
COUNTED UNTO HIM 
FOR RIGHTEOUSNESS" 
(Ver. 3). 

God, of course. had 
planned salvation through 
the redemptive work of 
Christ and would-and will-
save anyone who simply 
trusts Him and takes Hint 
at His Word. 

Since Abraham of 
course, more of God's Word 
has been revealed and we 
now know the details of 
Christ's death for sinners. If 
we now take God at His 
Word and simply trust 
Christ as Saviour, we are 
completely justified; for sal-
vation is not, cannot be. by . 
works: 

"But to him that work-
eth tint, but believeth on 
Him that justified the 
ungodly, HIS FAITH IS 
COUNTED FOR RIGHT-
EOUSNESS" (Rom. 4:5). 

Anew* 06 Gel 
Rev. A.W. Harris 
Sunday School - 9:15 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

Scut deoe Catkelit Ckwtek 
SCHOOL LUNCH 

MENUS 

FARWELL TEXICO 

Father Jerry Mueller 
Sunday Mass - 9 a.m. [MST] 
Confessions 
Sunday - 8:30 a.m. [MST] 
Phone 505/763-4445 

Wed Pedant/at Clwitrit 
Rev. L.L. Harris - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 
Wednesday Worship 7 p.m. 

MONDAY - Corndogs, 
French fries, ketchup, 
pickles, cherry cobbler, 
milk. 

TUESDAY - Chicken 
nuggets, whole new pota-
toes, green beans, hot 
rolls, jelly, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Sand-
wiches, French fries, 
ketchup, ice cream, milk. 

SCHOOL'S OUT - -
"Moms, they're yours 

for the summer!" 

FARM 
S  

AGENCY, INC. 

CAPITOL FOODS 

WIMP 

Cam] litioeiesa 
13aptiet Cita&

uj 
 

Mike Maurer - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

MONDAY - Corndogs 
with mustard, beans, pear 
and lime gelatin, cookie, 
milk, 

TUESDAY - Cheesebur-
gers, pickles, onions, let-
tuce, French fries, cob-
bler, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Pinto 
beans, wieners, cabbage 
salad, cornbread, ice 
cream, milk. 

THURSDAY - Salisbury 
steak, creamed potatoes, 
rolls, fruit salad, milk. 

FRIDAY - Chickenbur-
gers, lettuce, onions, pick-
les, fruit, milk. 

AUTO-FIRE-CASUALTY 
509 Ave. A - Ph. 481-3671 Kau Ligki Baptist. Ow. 

Thomas J. Spikes - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Services - 6:30 p.m. SHERLEY-ANDERSON- 

PITMAN, INC. Okfaitesta Lan 
Iftelitatliot am& 

Joel Ware - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Bible Study - Wed. 6 p.m. 

[winter] 5 13-nl- 
THE 

CITIZENS BANK 
ROSE DRUG 

St GIFT SHOP 

Prescriptions a Specialty 
481.3281 

Texico Branch 
Complete Bank Service 

Member FDIC 

Oittakeaut..ease 
Boast Ckwtek 

Wyatt Carpenter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 
Wednesday Eve. - 7 p.m. LOVELACE 

OIL CO. 
CECIL'S 

Tewp2e 'Baptist Ckwtck 

FUNDAMENTAL 
INDEPENDENT 
For Information 

Call 481-9208 

Woodrow Lovelace 
	

Ph. 481-9937 

Ch Your Payroll St. gesuee 
Luthetait Ckwitit 

Herman J. Schelter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 

U.S. Sen. Lloyd Bentsen, Room 240, Senate Office Building, 
Washington, D.C. 20510 Pho. 202-224-3121. 

U.S. Sen. John Tower, Room 142, Old Senate Office 
Building, Washington, D.C. 20510 Pho. 202-224-3121. 

Kasai* Iftestetiat 
Illetkedisl Ckwtek 

• 

.1•Thnirn-n• NIM 	  

ash 
Suclderth Realty, Inc. 

Drawer 687 - 109 5th St., Farwell, Tx. 79325 
Phone 806/481-3288 or 806/481-3388 

.................................... 

licensed in Texas, New Mexico and Oklahoma 
................................,...............m.~............,  

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 

Nice 3-bedroom, 1-bath stucco house with carport and 
large storage building in backyard. All on corner lot and 
priced to sell. 

••• 
Extra nice 3-bedroom, 134 bath brick home. Single car 
garage, fenced backyard, new carpet. Priced for 
immediate sale. 

••• 
Spacious 3-2-2 brick home with fenced yard. Makes this 
ideal home for the young family. 

••• 
On the corner with lots of country charm. 3-bedroom, 
2-bath stucco house. Lots and lots of closet space. Carport 
and steel storage building. Nice yard with garden area. 
Good location. 

••• 

Lots of space for a growing family in this 3 bedroom, 134 
bath house with fireplace, storm cellar, big backyard, 
and roomy area for hobbies and crafts. 

••• 
Get the family out of town and into this 3 bedroom, 15,2 
bath stucco house in Lariat. Has domestic well, central 
heat and air cond., insulated, garage, incinerator, 
corrals, and small feed shed. All on approximately 7/10 
acres. Just $20,000. 

••• 
Irrigation service and automotive shop complete with 
excellent equipment. Good insulated building. A going 
business! 	 .5. 

INVESTMENT PROPERTY 
Brick Tri-Plex. Each unit 2-bedroom, 1-bath with car-
port. 100% occupancy. Very nice. Possible 91/4 % loan 
assumption. 

FARM AND RANCH 

140 acres irrigated with circle sprinkler southwest of 
Muleshoe. 

••• 

160 acres irrigated, southwest of Farwell. 
••• 

160 acres. Lays nearly perfect. Excellent farm with two 
6-inch 	wells, 	water 	drive 	Valley. 	$700 	per 	acre, 
southwest of Friona. 

••• 

160 acres, irrigated, with sprinkler. Extra good water 
area near Oklahoma Lane. 

*O. 

160 acres irrigated 4 miles southwest of Bovina. 
••• 

162 acres irrigated joining Texico city limits on south. 
••• 

Ideal family f 	. 240 	s,Igraht 	, 	1 Bovina, 
good water a 	T 	ch 	ells, 	oom home 
with basem 	arg 	age 	e 	ncing avail- 
able. 

•••• 

320 acres irrigated, well improved, good water, good 
house, large insulated shop, east of Farwell. 

••• 

460 acres, three wells. Priced to sell. Good terms, 
••• 

466 acres, irrigated, 4 miles east of Bovina on highway. 
Lays nearly perfect. 

••• 
One of the prettiest sections in Parmer County, 1550 per 
acre, with $377 per 	acre 	good improvements. 	14 
irrigation wells, 3-bedroom, 2-bath stucco house with 
living and family rooms, basement, hand's house, barn 
with corrals, southwest of Friona. 

••• 

Pleasant Hill Area. 700 acres, 4 irrigation wells, has 
spacious, 	lovely, 	prestigious, 	country 	brick 	home. 	3 
bedroom, 3 bath, 3-car garage, on highway, with barns 
and corrals. 
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We Specialfre in Estates 

SAVING IS GREAT 

INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 
"Sales and Loans Are Our Service" 

U.S. Rep. Kent Hance, U.S. House of Representatives, 1610 
Longworth Building, Washington, D.C. 20515. Pho. 
202-225-4005. 

racial Mack 06 COW 
L.L. Ginning - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 

, Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

P2246aid 
Baptist Ckwtek 

Rob Reid - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

&wheal Sinutiak 
Baptist Kean 

Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:45 a.m. 
Church Training - 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

W dnesday Evenin s 7i00 

State Sen. Bill Sarpalius, Texas Senate, P.O. Box 12068. 
Capitol Station, Austin, Tx. 78711. 

Donald Ilolladay - Pastor 
Church School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	p.m. 

• 

• 



CROP HAIL INSURANCE 

15% DISCOUNT 

Crop hail rates for 1983 are discounted 15% off 

state rates. Protect your investment with Crop Hail 

Insurance from Farm Bureau. We give personal 

attention on all claims. 

PARMER COUNTY 

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE 
601 E. 11th - Friona - - 247-3963 

LARRY SUMMERS JERRY WILBOURN 

DAVID TIPPS JOHN MARS 

MIKE ELLIS 

Academic Awards Given 

At Texico High School 

State Line Tribune, Friday, May 20, 1983 - Pa e 13 

Cal Jordan Implements 
 

Around The 
Twin Cities 

Is New Computer Dealer 
Cal Jordan Implements, Inc. 

of Clovis has announced that it 
has signed a franchise agree-
ment to become a ValCom 
agricultural computer dealer. 
As part of the agreement they 
also become authorized dealers 
for the IBM Personal Com-
puter. 

Cal Jordan of the Clovis 
business said that the new 
venture will specialize in serv-
ing the agricultural market 
and will carry a broad array of 
software programs and related 
supplies in addition to the IBM 
Personal Computer. 

In making the announce-
ment, Jordan said that the 

president, Kevin West, vice-
president; Valda Cavallero, 
secretary; Corinna Hunger-
ford, treasurer; and Allan 
Hadley, Brad Steward, Danny 
Powell, Steve Smith, Melissa 
Singleterry, and Loretta Gon-
zales. 

Paula Leighton presented. 
Academic Achievement a-
wards to Earl Bibbs, achieve-
ment in world history; Billy 
Askew, Jay Duncan, and 
Travis Herrington, improve-
ment in English; Johnny 
Flores, achievement in math; 
David Robinson, improvement 
in math; Ricky Lebow, a-
chievement in civics and 
achievement in English; Terry 
Tubbs, improvement in lan-
guage; Lupe Hernandez, im-
provement in language and 
improvement in science; Lynn 
Richardson, achievement in 
United States history; Janie 
Esparta, achievement in sci-
ence; and Dale Autrey, im-
provement in studies. 

Kenneth Shaw presented 
Jesse Orozco with the Student 
of the Year award. 

Texico Women's Club presi-
dent Debra Autrey presented 
Sharlet Taylor with the Wo-
man's Club Scholarship award, 
and Anita Dimas received the 
Club/Organization Scholarship. 

Graduation awards went to 
Tammy Powell, historian; 
Ruth Scott, salutatorian; and 
Sharlet Taylor, valedictorian. 

THURSDAY, MAY 19 
Texico High School gradua-

tion ceremonies, 7 p.m. MDT 
in Wolverine Gym. 
FRIDAY, MAY 20 

Texico gymnasts will per-
form at 7 p.m. MDT in the old 
Texico gym. 
MONDAY, MAY 23 

Parmer County Commission-
ers Court will convene in the 
county courtroom. 
TUESDAY, MAY 24 

Texico City Council will meet 
in regular session at 6:30 p.m. 
MDT in city hall. 

Lazbuddie High School grad-
uation ceremonies at 8 p.m. in 
the school auditorium. 
WEDNESDAY, MAY 25 

Farwell Junior High awards 
assembly in the auditorium at 
10:30 a.m. 
THURSDAY, MAY 26 

Farwell eighth grade grad-
uation, 7:30 p.m. in the 
auditorium. 

Lazbuddie eighth grade 
graduation, 8 p.m. in the 
school auditorium. 

Texico-Farwell Senior Citi-
zens potluck supper and games 
night, 6 p.m. MDT in the 
Center. 

Blood pressure Clinic at 
Senior Citizens Center from 6-7 
p.m. MDT. 

computer is becoming as im-
portant to many farmers and 
ranchers as their tractor. 
"We'll be able to provide the 
local sales and service that our 
customers need," continued 
Jordan, "and our customer 
will have the advantage of 
dealing with someone who 
really knows the business of 
agriculture." 

Included among the over 50 
software programs offered by 
Cal Jordan Implements will be 
financial planning, farm ac-
counting, commodity informa-
tion, swine management, dairy 
management, beef manage-
ment, least cost rations, and 
crop analysis. 

Texas Highway Patrol 

Reports Area Accidents 
Texas Highway Patrol 

Trooper Craig Hunt reports 
that for the month of April, the 
THP Troopers investigated a 
total of 11 accidents in Parmer 
County. 

There were four injury 
accidents with a total of five 
persons injured, and seven 
property damage accidents. 

In District 5B, which in-
cludes the top 31 counties of 
the Texas Panhandle, there 
were 185 accidents investigated 
by the Texas Highway Patrol. 

Highway Patrol Captain Bob 
Russell reports that the THP 

Troopers investigated four 
fatal accidents with a total of 
six persons killed, 79 injury 
accidents with a total of 129 
persons injured, and 102 prop-
erty damage accidents. 

Daryl Ward of Cal Jordan 
Implements, Inc., of Clovis, 
seated, examines the new IBM 
Personal Computer which he 
will be selling as a ValCom 
dealer. Standing are LaVon 
Taylor, Valmont Industries, 

New Computer Dealer 
left, and Jim Hendrey, IBM. 
The Clovis business firm 
recently announced the signing 
of a franchise agreement to 
handle the ValCom agricultur-
al computers. 

Ringling Brothers started their first circus at Baraboo, 
Wisconsin in 1884. 

Summer Gymnastics 

Slated At Texico 
SMALLWOOD INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
Successors to 

High Plains Insurance 

AUTO • HOME • LIABILITY 

Up to 30% deviation on Home Insurance 
policies. Call us to see if you qualify to save. 

Ph. 806/272-4531 
	

Muleshoe, Tx. 

rollment will be on a first 
come, first served basis. Fee 
for the class is $5 per student. 

Requirements for the class 
are a current physical to be on 
file with the school, and par-
ental permission. 

Summer classes will be con-
ducted from 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
MDT Monday through Friday. 

Texico students wishing to 
participate in summer gym-
nastics should begin enroll-
ment procedures now. The 
class is open to Texico students 
who are in grades 1-12 this 
year. 

The summer gymnastics 
program will begin Monday, 
June 13, and end Friday, July 
8, according to Paula Leighton, 
gymnastics instructor. 

Registration forms may be 
obtained at the high school 
office. 

Class participation will be 
limited to 30 students, and en 

Mrstscloss  

Classified Ads 
Get Results 
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Woodman award. 
Ann Liethen presented the 

Social Studies and Business 
awards to Doug Thornton, Out- 
standing Typing I; Toby Odle, 
Outstanding Typing I; and 
Karen Snodgrass, Outstanding 
Typing I. Also receiving a-
wards were Cheryl Scott, Steve 
Miller, Bob Johnson, Christi 
Barfield, Dana Morris, Valda 
Cavallero, Elayne Horner, 
Chary Jesko, Rusty McCor-
mack, Sharla McDonald, and 
Rachel Jaramillo. 

Earl Bibbs received the Most 
Improved Hardest Worker 
Typing I award; Anna Gross, 
Most Improved; Lynn Tubbs, 
Most Improved; Sharlet Tay-
lor, Outstanding Accounting. 
Also receiving awards in ac-
counting were Ruth Scott, 
Tobin Tate, and Danny Reid. 

Sharlet Taylor received the 
Outstanding Intensive Office 
award; and Dennis Chavez, 
Jeannie Chavez, Ruth Scott, 
and DeVona Harris each re-
ceived intensive office awards. 
Sherri Merrill received the 
Outstanding 	Government 
award. 

Sylvia Burgett presented 
Lynn Robinson and Paula 
Nousiainen with Art awards. 

Roy King presented Wayne 
Wolfe, Helen Boarman, and 
Kelly Lynn with Physical Ed-
ucation awards. 

In home economics, Kendale 
Burch presented three awards 
to Sherri Merrill, home eco-
nomics I; Paula Nousiainen, 
home economics II; and Dana 
Morris, family living. 

Ronnie Warmuth presented 
the Math awards to Kevin 
West, computer math; Steve 
Miller, geometry; Mark 
Meeks, algebra I; and Tobin 
Tate, general math. He also 
presented Sharlet Taylor with 
the Yearbook Editor award. 

Academic Achievement a-
wards were presented by Joan 
Edwards to Wayne Wolfe, 
reading and language arts, and 
Lupe Hernandez, math, 

Carol Brock presented Math 
awards to Buck Gaddis, con-
sumer math; and Dennis 
Chavez, most improved in con-
sumer math. 

Science awards were pre-
sented by Nadine Maben to 
Lucia Jesko, physical science; 
Danny Powell, biology I; 
Ronnie Dunsworth, biology II; 
Johnny Torres, physiology; 
and Sharlet Taylor, chemistry. 

Student Council awards were 
presented to Jesse Orozco, 

Texico High School's Aca-
demic Awards program was 
held Wednesday, May 11, 
honoring many students. 

Jesse Orozco was presented 
the prestigious Student of the 
Year Award, Sharlet Taylor 
received the Texico Women's 
Club Scholarship, and Anita 
Dimas received the Club/Or-
ganization Scholarship. 

The program began with 
Jesse Orozco, Student Council 
president, leading the pledge of 
allegiance, followed by Ken-
neth Shaw, high school princi-
pal, presenting the attendance 
awards. 

Receiving the attendance 
awards were: 

Freshmen: Helen Jo Boar-
man, Jesse Garcia, Loretta a   
Gonzales, Eric Harding, In-
dolina Estrada, Bernadette 
Flores, Timmy Meier, Melanie 
Furrow, Wayne Wolfe, and 
Brenda Morris; 

Sophomores: Billy Bibbs, 
Doug Thornton, Lonnie Smith, 
Buck Gaddis, and Phillip 
Lambert; 

Juniors, Tommy Boarman, 
Dennis Chavez, Kevin Akers, 
Les Frodin, Steve Miller, Dana 

is Morris, Johnny Torres, and 
Ronnie Dunsworth; 

Seniors: Travis Herrington, 
Jackie Burk, and Earl Bibbs, 

Kevin West, Student Council 
vice-president, introduced the 
faculty members. 

Vocational Agriculture A-
wards were presented by 
Eddie West to Jesse Orozco, 
beef and dairy; Karen 	

a
Snod- 

grass, shop I; Scott Elliott, 
RV shop II; Ronnie Dunsworth, 

sheep and swine; and Mark 
Meeks, Ag I. 

Kay West presented the 
English and Journalism a-
wards to Sherri Merrill, Eng-
lish I; Cheryl Scott, English II; 
Sharla McDonald, English H; 
Chary Jesko, English III; 
Kevin West, English III; and 
Robert Meier, journalism. 

Presenting the English, 
Speech and Spanish awards 

was Juanita Hadley. Recip- 
ients were Steve Miller, Eng-
lish III and IV; Jeannie 
Chavez, speech; and Doug 
Thornton, Spanish. 

David Lynn presented the 
Social Studies and Drivers Ed- 
ucation awards to Jeannie 
Chavez, POD; Les Frodin, 
United States history; Timmy 

aMeier, world history and cul-
tures; Maria Jimenez, drivers 
education bookwork; and Rob-
ert Meier, American History 

BILL PENNINGTON 
REMODELING - GENERAL CARPENTRY - PAINTING 

ROOFING - AIR CONDITIONING - PLUMBING 

OUT OF TOWN JOBS WELCOME 
Ph. 806/481-9078 after 5 p.m. 

411 8th Street 	Farwell, Tx. 

• 

THESE VARIETIES 
HAVE PROVEN 
THEMSELVES IN 

PARMER 

PR80 
• 

Outstanding micronaire and yield record. 
Storm resistance to survive tough condi-
tions. Excellent disease protection. 

Congratulation To Lazbuddie Seniors Of 1983 

Ph. 806/825-3953 
• 

rik)  GILBERT KALTWASSER 
Farwell, Texas 

PIONEER. SHERLEY - ANDERSON 
LAZBUDDIE ELEVATOR 

WOOLEY INTERNATIONAL 
MULESHOE 

• Aspsitr14 ir.dnt et Ow*. HIS,.. M orrunonsi, Inc 
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itatien 0114 rim* and nurses IMNIssing Oa Ins late Is part *I Me Nest 01 Ss 



P195-14 - $72.00 

P205-14 - $88." 

P205-15 - $ 	9.0 0 

P215-15 - $92.0° 

P225-15 - $94.00 

P235-15 - $96.00 

Limited Quantities 
On Some Sizes 
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Wolverine Booster Officers 

Newly-elected officers of the conducted at the football field, 
Texico Wolverine Booster Club and is to be followed by re-
have scheduled a lift-a-thon freshments served by Booster 
Tuesday, May 24, at 7 p.m. Club members, New officers 
MDT. The lift-a-thon will be are, from left, Kathy Morris, 

vice-president; James Holland. 
president; Donna Reid, secre-
tary; and Weldon Smith. 
treasurer. 

Texico Boosters Slate Lift-A-Thon 
Texico Wolverine Booster 

Club is sponsoring a Lift-A-
Thon Tuesday, May 24, at 7 
p.m. MDT at the Texico 
football field. 

Athletes who have been par-
ticipating in the weightlifting 
program are taking pledges 
and will exercise their weight-
lifting skills at the event. 

Donors may pledge a speci-
fied amount of their own 
choosing to an athlete, and the 
total amount of the contribu-
tion will be determined by the 
actual amount the athlete lifts 
Tuesday evening. 

Following the Lift-A-Thon, 
Booster Club members will 
call on the donors to collect the 
pledges. 

"Anyone can lift and anyone 
can pledge," said Coach David 
Lynn about the event. "Schools 
in other areas have had 
Lift-A-Thons and they have all 
reported fun-filled events," he 
added. 

There is no admission to the 
activity, and everyone is urged 
to come out and cheer on the 

athletes as they endeavor to 
out-lift each other. Weight-
lifters are not restricted to 
those enrolled in the Texico 
athletic program; so anyone 
who would like to demonstrate 
his ability may participate. 

Booster Club members will 
sell homemade ice cream, 

Parmer County Judge Porter 
Roberts handed down two 
sentences Friday, May 13. 

Lewis Vasquez, 25, of Friona, 
pled guilty to possession of 
marijuana. He was fined $185 

cake, soft drinks, and coffee 
during the evening. All pro-
ceeds from the event will be 
used by the Booster Club to 
support the Texico athletic 
programs. 

In the event of inclement 
weather, the Lift-A-Thou will 
be held indoors. 

plus court costs. 
Craig Lookingbill, 20, of 

Friona pled guilty to criminal 
mischief. He was fined 5175 
plus court costs, and was 
ordered to make restitution in 
the amount of $435.43. 

Parmer County Court Results 

MEMORIAL MONUMENTS 
Lasting Beauty In Granite, Marble or Bronze 

Sales - Installation - Curbing 
MUFFLE' FUNERAL HOME 
920 Main - Clovis - 762-4435 

MICHELIN 
Tire Sale 

Muffler & Exhaust 
Work Oil Changing 

Tri County Tire 
501 Ave. A, Farwell - 481.3395 
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SIRLOIN 
Choice Beef 

TIP STEAK 1.98 Lb. Select Sliced 

BEEF LIVER 	89t. 
USDA 

CHUCK 
Choice Beef Boneless . 

STEAK 	41•79 . 
Wilson Certified 
Lb 	Pkg. 

BACON 	$1.59 

Kraft 
AMERICAN 

Singles 12 oz Pkg A 
CHEESE $1.5, 

Shurfine 11.b. Can 

COFFEE 	1.89 
Del 

PEACHES 
 Monte No. 303 

59$ 
Shurfine 251b. Bag 
P
rintoTia 	 $3.99 

Honey 

PINK 
Boy 15 oz 	 ... 

SALMON 	159DIAPERS 
All 
Kleenex 

Sizes Sizes Huggi es 	
$2.99 

Zee 

NAPKINS 140 Count 	
69 

Hunts 
Big 44oz. 

CATSUP 
Jug '1.59 

Butter 
NOW 

CRISCO 

flavored 
31b. Can 

42.19 

Libby's Soz. 

VIENNA SAUSAGE 	2/79' 
6Pk 

COCA-COLA 
32oz. 	

p. ...l ir 4 0 P 	 ” 

(fik CoKe 	
$

l•YY 
Aih 

California Fresh 
, STRAWBERRIES 69tt. 

Shurfresh 
Extra 

EGGS 
Large 79 

q Texas 
CABBAGE 	9' lb. 

Van 
White 
HOMINY 

Camp No. 300 
- Yellow 	Voc,„,0 	21890 

416.,;i„,,, 	0 
California Baby

69° th. 	
A 

Del Monte No. 303 
Whole Kemal Cream Style 
CORN 	 2189' Texas Jalapeno 

PEPPERS 	59s.. 
Del Monte No. 303 	Cut 10 
GREEN BEANS 	2/69' 

co.. U.S. No. 1 
lb Bag 

RUSSET POTATOES $1.09 
Del Monte No. 

ENGLISH 
303 
PEAS 	2189' 

Welch 12oz. Can 

GRAPE JUICE 79' 

SPINACH
e 03 2189' 

Borden's 

ICE CREAM 1.69 
Del Monte 8 oz 411.00 TOMATO SAUCE 2179' 

Patio 5 oz 

BURRITOS (Assorted) 

Del Monte No. 303 	 I 

FRUIT COCKTAIL 	69v 
Banquet 14 oz 

CREAM PIES 	(Assorted) 	79teh 
ifilraLi'TNEE CAE11216 see 

rfie.'' 
9000 
0000 
060C 
ease 

ot, 
tel: 
e 'I i 0 „...1.4 
Zit') 

900 Ave. A 	'T r  isr:_iik_4(0 , ,, 	,. ,, , 	Open TO 9 o'clock Ivory Night 
Farwell 	 1 	---1 	,, 	2 
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