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Present indications are that the 
storage space for grain sorghumS 
will be the most critical ever exper-
ienced in this region, a check, with 
local grain men forecast ,today. 

At present, there is some storage 
space available, and much additional 
storage is being made ready just as 
rapidly as postsible, but harvesting of 
the fall crop is just getting under-
way and' it is being freely admitted 
by grainibuyers that all the avail-
able space will not accommodate the 
grain produced here, with a record 
crop in prospect.  

The chief bottleneck appears to be 
in the fact that all elevators of the 
country are still- virtually filled with 
the 1949 wheat crop, to say nothing 
of the 1948 grain sorghums still on 
storage in the county. Furthermora 
it appears certain that another 
shortage of rail cars faces this region 
Outgoing shipments of grain—both 
wheat and sorghums—have been de-
layed by the lack of cars, grain men 
said today. 

The Roberts Seed Co. in Texico is 
building additional storage and the 
Sherley Grain Co. at Bovina has just 
statred Inother 350,000 bushel eleva-
tor there, with both these firms ex-
pecting completion by Oct. 20. In 
addition, Ray Ford • at the Farwell 
Elevator says he has terminal stor-
age to offer, and the J-A Grain Com-
pany, Lariat, has an expansion prog-
rm underway. With all this addition-
al storage being made ready, it still 
w-421 not take care of the grain crop 
here this year, in the opinion of lo-
cal buyers. 

"Farmers might just as well begin 
to make plans to dump a large part 
of their grain on the ground," one 
buyer said. 
	0 	 

Cattle Stealing On 
Increase Near Here 

Sheriff Chas. Lovelace reported 
today that while there had been no 
reported cattle thefts in Partner 
County during recent weeks, reports 
from nearby counties say that such 
thievery is on the increase. 

The sheriff of Lamb County re-
ports the loss of ,18 head during the 
past few months, and Castro County 
stockmen have been hard hit by cat-
tle thieves recently, Sheriff Lovelace 
said. 

Officers 'are inclined to believe 
that the thieves a-are operating it 
Dick-ups or small trucks and that the 
cattle are hauled out of the country 
before they are ever missed. In most 
cases reported lately, one and two 
head have disappeared, with the 
rustelrs expressing no favoritism be-
tween beef cattle and milk cows. 

Sheriff Lovelace had only taw( 
suggestions to make for combatting 
the practice: Examine herds regu-
larly and frequently, and report im 
mediately any losses; he on the 
lookout for strange trucks and pick-
ups, and make • a note of the license 
number. 

Telephone Service 
Is Improving 

Telephone service in Texico-Far-
well has been showing improvement 
during the past two weeks, for 
which the local patrons are grateful. 

L. L. Gracey, manager of the 
Mountain Statet Telephone Co., of 
Clovis, was here on Tuesday an? 
said that additional local equipment 
had been recently installed, and ex-
pressed the opinion the service here 
would improve. 

At present, there are three circuits 

( into Clovis, Gracey said. and these 
lines appear to be handling the lo-
aal traffic fairly satisfactorily, al 
thuogh there are times when all cir-
cuits are engaged simultaneously 
causing a de'ay in placing long dis-
tance calls. Gracey promised an ad-
ditional circuit to Clovis of the pres-
ent facilities prove inadequate. 

District Judee C. D. Ruseell, of 
Plainview, will be here Friday to 
meet with the Jury Commission for 
the purpose of drawing members of 
the Grand Jury, who will serve for 
the next six months, beginning on 
January 1st, 1950. 

• • • * 

I want to join the many other peo-
ple I have heard express themselves 
in congratulating Mrs. Erma Jobes 
on the splendid progress her recent-
ly-organized school band is making. 
Patrons of the school swelled with 

-pride when the youngsters, Wider the 
direction of Mrs. Jobes, made their 
first public appearance at the foot-
ball game last Friday night. All dik-
ed out in their flashy new blue and 
white uniforms, the youngsters made 
a most favorable impression as they 
paraded the field between halves. 

• • 
Officers at the local bank asked 

that I write an article warning peo-
ple against transient magzine-sub-
seription peddlers that are.continual-
ly infesting the town. "They cause us 
more grief than all our • customers 
combined," one official said. I was all 
-set  to write a hot Hopper about such 
practice when in walked a mag ped-
ler with instruction from my wife to 
write him a check for a 2-year sub to 
The Collier's magazine. So, it ap-

-sear sthat anything I might say art 
the subject would be wholly out of 
order. I will add, however, even if I 
am stung by this peddler, that giving 
your subscription to such peddlers is 
a rather risky business. 

* • * • 

Present calculations lead me to be-
lieve that I came out loser last Sun-
day afternoon when my wife and I 
drove out to help Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Thomas celebrate the open-
-Mg of their new home. As things 
stack up now, I am loser of a new 
$15 hat and a gift of silverware, and 
all I got was a piece of cake and a 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE TEXICO  N ew Mexico 

	 asql 

THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 2) 94 	TWELVE PAGES 	 NUMBER 56 

FARWELL 
Texas 

FARWELL, FARMER COUNTY, TEXAS THIRTY-EIGHTH YEAR 

Parmer Exhibit 
1st at Lubbock swine were on display at Friona the 

past weekend for the "best yet" of 
ithe annual Penner County Dairy 
!Show and Fair exhibitions. 
i 	The fair opened on Thursday, with 
the majority of animals in the barns 
by early in the afternoon, and stalls 
were full long before the owners 
ceased arriving with new entries. 
Hasty arrangements were made to 
house the extras in the inside quad-
rangle of the show buildings, and 
some Jersey stock was even tethered 

'outside the barns. 
Interest leaped this year, with en- 

tries climbing in every division. Ro-
l bert Morton, of the Farwell FFA de-
patrment, who headed up the swine 

I division; reported that he had listed' 
a total of 97 animals, "not counting' 
the numerous litters", and J. T. Gee?  
Friona ag man, said that he had not 
made a complete tally but over -175 
livestock entries were on hand. 

Judges T. L. Leach of Texas Tech, 
Raymond King, Castro county agent, 
and Morgan Dennis, Castro Short-
horn breeder, paid high praise to the 
quality as well as quantity of stock 
exhibited at the show, with Leach 
commenting that the Parmer entries 
in the aggregate were the best he 
had seen in the area. 

Scmething new was added this 
year with each community of the 
county preparing a booth showing 
the various field, garden and orchard 
crops of that particular locality, and 
the women, not to be out-done, turn-
ed out their choice selection of love-
ly handwork for the home arts divi-
sion, presided over by Mrs. Bertie 
Stowers. 	 • 

Grain Storage Short 
As Harvest Opens 

Skunks In The House? 
No, Just Overdose • 
Of Calaordant 

Housewives who have been 
searching their premises for in-
truding polecats can breathe easily 
again. 

Bill Banks, the local gas man, 
has come up with the answer to 
those obnoxious fumes about the 
horaes of local reisdents. 

He explains that an overdose of 
calaordant—required by State 
law—was injected into the gas 
lines last Saturday with the re-
sult that fumes around natural 
gas appliances has been rather 
pungent. 

Polio Fund Swells 
Over Parmer Co. 

The Parmer County agricultural] 
the Panhandle-South Plains Fair at • 

- th Panhandle-South Plains Fair at 
Lubbock, which opened in that city 
on Monday. 

Placing second was the Floy4 
• County exhibit, with Castro County, 

rated third. 
This is the fourth consecutive year 

a. that Parmer County has placed high 
in the agricultural division, winning 
two blue ribbons, one second and 
one third over the four-year period. 
In 1946 Parmer county rated second: 
moved up to first money in 1947; and 
the following year dropped to third 
place, only to come back again with 
top honors in 1949. 

County Agent 011ie Liner, with 
the assistance of Robert Morton, ag- 
ricultural director of the Farwell 
High School, assembled and arrang-
ed the display that topped the other 
entries in Monday's judging. 

PartneraCounty individual exhibits 
also ranked high, garnering seven 
blue ribbons and one red at the Lub-
bock show. Harold Carpenter took 
first in alfalfa bundles; Mrs. Harold 
Carpenter won top honors with but-
ter beans; Jimmie McGuire led the 
list with barley; Owen Patton placed 
first with hegarii and Donnie Car-
penter's pumpkin led the field. Har-
old Carpenter also rated second with 
his cow pea exhibit. 

1 	Contributing items for the exhibit 
were N. L. Tharp, alfalfa bale; Alfa 
Dosher, sudan bale; Bill Meeks, mix-
ed pasture grasses; Jack Waltmon, 
sweet sorghums; Judge Barker, wa-
termelons; A. L. Hartzog, pumpkin 
and winter squash; Harold Carpent-
er, butter beans and pinto beans. 

Grains: wheat, Joe Jesko; barley, 
Joe Menefee; oats, Bruce. Parr; milo, 
Clyde Sherrieb; hegari, etai. 
black-eyed peas, Judge Barker; 
Chinese Red peas, Jimmy McGuire; 
alfalfa bundle, Lee Sudderth; sudan 
and oat bundes, Levi Johnson; sweet 
sorghum bundle, Jack Waltmon; per-
manent pasture grasses, Harold Car-
penter; kaffir heads, Oscar Hubble; 
pears, Mrs. Ezell; and peaches, Mrs. 
Lee Sudderth. 

Frank Lee (Buddy) Smith, 17-year-
old son of Ray Smith- of Friona, be-
carne the victim of a tragic hunting 
accident, Sunday afternoon, when 
he and two companions, Jackie Lu-
per and Darrell Franklin, were on 
an outing near Friona. 

The accident occurred at the old 
Reed lake, about five miles north of 
Friona, where the boys had been tar-
get shooting with a .22 pistol and a 
shot gun. Relatives who talked to 
the boys reported that young Luper 
handed the gun through the window 
to Smith, on the outside of the car, 
and the pistol was accidentally -dis-
charged. 

The bullet, a powerful long-range 
.22 load, entered the boy's shoulder 

Although no definite check has 
been trade up to this time, Loyde 
Brewer, chairman of the Infantile 
Paralysis Committee in Parmer 
County, said the response to the 
emergency drive was believed to be 
very satisfactory. 

Brewer added that he expected to 
check all receipts on Saturday of this 
week. Several checks, as well as 
cash, it was learned here, have beer 
sent direct to Dallas and no account-
ing has been made of such monies, 
Brewer said. 

Meanwhile, Brewer urged all con-
tributors to turn their money to their 
local postmasters before the close of 
the present week, deadline for the 
emergency fund drive. 

Mrs. Mayfield, Polio 
Victim, Shows Some 
Improvement, Report 

Mrs. J. T. Mayfield, Lazbuddy 
farm woman, who was stricken with 
polio several days ago, is reported by 
her husband to be showing slight 
improvement. 

Mrs. Mayfield is receiving treat-
ment at the Hendrick Memorial Hos-
pital, where she was taken after be-
ing stricken and her husband reports 
that "she still suffers a lot, although 
she is able to force a slight move-
ment of one of her legs". 

just below the blade on the right 
, side and ranged downward toward 
the heart. 

Luper and r n n loaded Buddy 
into the car and started for town, 
only to have trouble with their auto. 
John Lynn, who lives near the scene 
of the shooting, picked up the victim 
and rushed him to the Friona hospi-
tal. Leo McLellan, manager at the 
hospital, said the boy was dead 
when received around 5 o'clock, and 
Lynn is of the opinion that Smith 
had died before he took him into his 
car. 

Funeral services were held Tues-
day afternoon at 2 o'clock in the Fri-
ona Baptist Church, with the pastor 
Rev. T. B. Allen, in charge. 

The lad is survived by his father 
Ray Smith; a sister, Mrs. Gen Min 
gus; and two brothers, John and Da 
vid, all of Friona. 

Consumers Grocery At 
Bovina Changes Hands 

Woman Is Being Held 
On Forgery Charge 

Sheriff Chas. Lovelace said today 
that Mrs. Caroline McOuan, about 
24 years of age, was being returned 
to this city from Hereford, where 
charges of forgery would be filed 
against her. She was arrested in Jef-
ferson, Ohio, officers said. 

Mrs. McCuan is alleged to have 
forged the name of Mrs. George Rob-
erson of Hereford to two checks 
which she passed at Bovina last Ju-
ly. One -of. the checks was given to 
H. C. Jackson and the other was 
cashed at the Bonds Service Station, 
both in Bovina officers here report. 

Being held in Hereford is Ike Al-
len, who was wanted by Deaf Smith 
authorities. Allen, officers say, was 
arrested with Mrs. McCuan in Ohio. 
Mrs. McCuan is- also understood to 
have passed a forged check in Texico 
when she made her appearance here 
in July. 	 • 

-/
FROM THE HOPPER 

Attend Funeral Of 
Aged Dimmitt Lady 

Dr. Spring Named As 
School Physician 

Dr. Paul L. Spring, of Friona, has 
been named school physician of this 
county, County Judge A. D. Smith 
announced today. 

Under the provisions of the re-
cently enacted Gilmer-Aiken bill, 
each county will be allowed a coun-
ty health nurse of a school physician 
and Penner chose a physician. 

Schools of the county will cooper-
ate in the cost of maintaining the 
new office, with a good share of the 
fund coming from the State. Asked 
about the duties of the school physi-
cian, Judge Smith said that he had 
not gone into the details of this 
phase of the law. "There is so much 
new legislation in connection with 
the Gilmer-Aiken Act that I have 
not had time to study it thoroughly," 
he said. 

Grand Champions Listed 
Fred Kepley, of the Oklahoma 

Lane community, was probably one 
of the proudest exhibitors at the fair, 
for his Shorthorn bull took grand 
champion honors in his first appear-
ance at the fair. Taking grand cham-
pion rating for the second consecu-
tive year was the Shorthorn female 
exhibited by John • S. ,and Maxine 
Thompson. 

"Volunteer", pride and joy of the 
Friona FFA's group of beautiful Jer-
sey animals, was again the grand 
champion bull of his division, while 
a Jersey cow owned by Ray Strick-
land of the Friona FFA group, snag-
ged top honors for her owner. 

Elmer Langford, of this city, exhi-
bited both grand champions in the 
Hereford division, D. C. Burnett of 
Friona made a clean sweep of the 
Brown Swiss division, as did Gary 
Crow in the Guernsey and Holsteina  
Friesian departments. 

Donnie Carpenter and. Darrell Nor-
ton, both of Farwell, each took a 
grand champion honor in the swine 
division, and each showed Chester 
Whites. Carpenter had the top rank-
ing sow while Norton showed the 
boar. 
Farwell Booth Wins 

In the community exhibits, the 
Farwell booth was placed first, with 
a total of 601 points scored. Jimmy 
McGuire was chairman of the coma  
mittee, with John Aldridge and Joe 
Camp as members to prepare the 
entry. 

Second-place community honors 
went to Lakeview, with a total of 
590 points; Oklahoma Lane was a 
close third with 589; Black scored 
586 for fourth; Friona, 581 points for 
fifth; Bovina, sixth with 575; and 
Lazbuddy 574 points for seventW 
The Rhea community also exhibited. 

FFA booths from the county chap-
ters were predominant in intereat, 
with most comment coming on the 
clever Bovina arrangement of a 
"Punkin-Head Farmer". 

Some of the home arts department 
entries drew especial interest from 
the large crowds that flocked to the 
fair, and one of the most talked-
about articles was a Spread, made be-
fore the Civil War of handmade 
thread. It was shown by Mrs. Ken- 

(Continued on last page) 

Sherley Grain Adding 
New Elevator, Bovina 

Mr. and Mrs. George.  McLean of 
Friona, Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Dixon 
of the Rhea community, Mr. and 
Mrs. Stacey Queen of Bovina, are 
Mrs. J. J. Spurlin of this city, drove 
to Dimmitt, Monday, to attend the 
funeral of Mrs. Rosa McLean, pio-
neer resident of Dimmitt. 

Mrs. McLean, - who, would have 
been 90 years old next November. 
passed away in the Parmer County 
Community Hospital at -Friona, las' 
Saturday. She had been an invalid 
for a long time ,spending the past 
several years in a wheel chair. 

Mr. and Mrs. McLean came -to 
Dimmitt in 1897 from Missouri, and 
she had been a Dimmitt resident 
since that time. Her husband died 
some 30 years ago, and Since that 
time she had lived alone with the aid 
of a housekeeper, keeping up the 
various business interests her hus-
band had established before his 
death. 

She is survived by three daugh-
ters, Mrs. C. W. Dixon, Friona; Mrs. 
J. A. Hudges, Lubbock; and Mrs. C. 
W. Anthony, Dimmitt. Thirteen 
grandchildren and 15 great-grana-
children also suxvive. 

By HOP 

The Parmer County Fair has alrea- 
dy outgrow its facilities. Now is the 
time to begin making plans for next 
year's show, by making sure that 
there will be plenty of room provid-

' ed for the proper display of our fine 
livestock, agricultural products and 

-other worthwhile exhibits. The entire 
county should cooperate in this un-
dertaking, for it is one of the most 
outstanding county projects and de-
serves our earnest attention. 

Construction work was started last 
week on an additional grain elevator 
by the Sherley Grain Co. of Bovina, 
and it is expected to be ready for use 
before November 1, G. D. Anderson. 
Jr., manager of the 1rm, stated ear-
ly this week. 

Anderson stated that four addi-
tional.concrete and steel tanks, with 
a cacity of 350,000 bushels, were 
beir(' erected at the Bovina plant, 
which would give the firm a total 
storage capacity of 875,000 bushels. 

`The new tanks are being raised be-
tween the office building and the 
main elevator bins. All bins will be 
connected and operated from one 
single dumping pit. 

TECH CAMPUS SIZE 
Tech College campus at Lubbock 

covers 2,000 acres-1,700 of which 
are used by the animal husbandry, 
dairy manufacturers and other agri-
culture depatrments. 

FIRE THREATENS 
A trash fire late last Friday after-

noon at the rear of Hall's Grocery 
caused a run by the fire department. 
A small building, which was filled 
with discarded paper cartons and 
other highly combustable articles 
caught fire and momentarily threat-
ened to spread to the main building 
of the establishment. 

County Leases More School Land 

A deal was closed last week in 
which stockholders of the Consum-
ers Fuel Association at Bovirald 
the giocery and market business tr 
Venable & Combs, merchants o. 
that city. 

Combs announced that the Ven-
able & Combs stock would be con• 
solidated with-  the Consumer stock 
at the latter location. The deal in-
volves the grocery and meat stock 
as well as the locker plant, of the 
cooperative, but does not include the 
fuel and tire businests, it was stated.  

Luther GrisSom, of the Oklahoma 
Lane community, has purchased th( 
building occupied by the Consumer 
on Main street in Bovina and Ven-
able & Combs have leased the loca-
tion from him. 
	0 	 

Steel Arrives For Use 
On Texico Gymnasium 

Steel frames were unloaded the 
first of the week at the site, of the 
new Texico gymnasium, now under 
construction on the school campus 
Supt. Agrie Jones reported, adding.  
"I was relieved to tee them come in. 
fearing we might get tied up on this 
material, due to the current steel sit-
uation." 

Practically all of the cement un-
der-floor base has been poured at the 
site and brick tile walls have reached 
a height of 5 feet in most instances 
lending encouragement to the hopes 
that the building may be occupied 
by Christmas or the first of the year 

As soon as sports can be moved 
into the new building, workmen will 
begin remodeling the interior of the 
old gymnasium, arranging a number 
of class rooms for the growing 
school. 

Close Games Played At 
Grady, Friday Night 

Two close games were played by 
the Texico -and Grady softball team 
the.past Friday night on the lighted 
diamond at Grady, with the locals 
coming out behind in both encount-
ers. 

Particularly heartbreaking wa; 
the downfall of the Texico girls, who 
were leading 3-2 when Grady came 
up for the final time. With two out 
and the bases loaded, Bailey stepped 
in to connect with a grand slam 
homer and Grady went out, 6-3. 

The boys' game, which ended 7-4' 
was called at the end of the fourth 
inning because of the hour, Coach C. 
B. Stockton reported today. 

Tucker was on the mound for the 
boys while Patsy Engram did the 
pitching for the girls. 

,a The Commissioners Court, in ses-
sion here Monday, leased 531.3 acre: 
of Parmer County school land, locat-
ed in Andrews and Gaines counties 
to Ben Harwith, of Midland. 

In exchange for the lease, Parmer 
County received $10.00 per acre bo-
nus. The lease runs for 10 years with 
annual payments at the rate of $1 
per acer leased in addition to the bo-
nus. 

Money realized from the lease goes 
into the Parmer County Permanent 
School Fund and will be invested in 
government bonds, with the interest 

few small glasses of punch. I am tell-
ing Claude now that it will take sev-
eral juicy venison steaks to square 
the account. 

from the bonds going to the schools 
of the county. , 

Already more than $100,000 has 
been realized from the sale of oil 
leases, royalties and rentals from 
the Parmer County school lands lo-
cated in the two South Plains coun-
ties. Most Olathe land is surrounded 
by producing oil wells, but none has 
been discovered on property belong-
ing to this county. 

County officials maintain that if 
oil is ever found on these lands ,the 
school funds of the county will tie 
materially benefitted. 

TO MOVE HERE 

Mr. and Mrs. Alonzo Owens and 
family, of Cumberland, Ky., are 
making plans to move to Texico, 
where they-  will- make their home 
Mrs. Owens is already here and ex-
pects to be joined by her husband in 
the near future. Owens, who is em-
ployed in the coal mines in Ken-
tucky, is reported to be seeking r 
place to live where 1..0s work will not 
be interrupted by repeated strikes. 
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Protects Property 
You Can't Replace 

When post-war scarcities 
make property hard to re-
place, your possessions need 
the long-lasting protection of 
Pioneer Paint. 

Made in the Southwest for 
the Southwest, Pioneer Paint 
gives special resistance to 
penetrating sun rays. That 
means longer-lasting protec-
tion for your property, be-
cause Pioneer Paint stays on 
longer without chalking, 
cracking or fading. 
Keep your property safe with 
sun-resistant Pioneer Paint. 
Get long-lasting Fioneer 
Paint now. 

CLOVIS. N. M. 

Gas Heaters 
If you will be needing a new gas heater this win-
ter, we invite you to come in and look over our 
stock of approved heaters, 

We have them in almost any type you might de-
sire, from a small bathroom heater to the large 
circulators. equipped for either natural gas or 
butane. 

Let us figure with you on that new gas range 
you have been promising your wife. 

C. G. Davis Merc. Co. 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

Time to turn on 

IDMP 

    

Guaranteed Radiator 

REPAIR SERVICE 

AT 

STOVALL'S 
The Most Modern Shop 

In New Mexico 

Half block West Hotel Clovis 

 

• • 	• 
B. N. GRAHAM 

INSURANCE 

OF ALL KINDS 

Farwell, Texas 

• • 	• 

 

    

    

    

Feet hurt? It may 

be due only to 

faulty Shoes. We 

restore your shoes 
to perfect walking 
order. 

Electric Shoe Shop 

Texico, N. NI. 

amagnmainsta  

DUPONT 
PAINTS 
• HOUSE PAINT 

• DUCO ENAMEL 

• DeLUXE MARINE 

BOAT ENAMEL 

• BARN PAINT 

• 
WALL PAPER 

We carry the most complete 

line of wall paper shown in 

Clovis. See the new patterns. 

G. C. WILLIAMS 
PAINT STORE 
119 East 5th St.  

Bus. Ph. 4033—Res. Ph. 6765 

CLOVIS, N. M. 
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During the first few months of a 
baby's life, he needs more night-
gowns than dresses and pretty 
clothes. Nightgowns should be easy 
to wash, quickly dried, easy to put 
on, comfortable and warm. 

A naturalist says that alligators GONE WITH THE WIND" 
are harmless so long as you can keep RETURNS TO BORDER 
their mouths closed. For that matter 

Scotty Levins, of the local Border so are gossips. 	  Theater, announced today that he 
would show "Gone With The Wind" 
at the ldcal movie house on Sunday 
and Monday, October 2nd and 3rd. 

Two features will be run on Sun 
day with the first one starting at 
2:30 p. m. and the second at 6:43. 
Only one showing is scheduled for 
Monday, with starting time at 8 p. in 

In announcing the return of thit 
film Levins said that those who arc 
interested in seeing the picture, eith-
er for the first time or for a repeat, 
should take advantage of the local  
showing, as the film is to be taken 
out of circulation in December. - 

Health Note 
Texas State Department of Health 

Clovis Tent & Awning 

Canvas and Aluminum Awnings, 

Venetian Blinds, Car Upholstery, 

Furniture Upholstery 

1101 W. 7th 	 Dial 6343 

Clovis, N. M. 
Baton Rouge is the capitol of Loui 

siana. 

We Have Moved 
In order that we may be able to serve our 

customers better, we have moved our 

cafe two doors east and are now located 

in the Felix Monroe building, formerly 

occupied by the postoff ice. 

We will appreciate a continued share of 

your patronage and strive to please you 

in every detail. 

Mary's Cafe 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Sudderth 

FARWELL, TEXAS 
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AUSTIN—Now is the time to have 
your baby protected from whooping 
cough, says Dr. Geo. W. Cox, State 
Health Officer. The Texas State De-
partment of Health recommends 
that vaccination against this disease 
be administered at three months of 
age with a booster dare of vaccine 
when -the child is two years old 
There is many a child whose life 
could have been saved if he had 
been immunized in infancy, said Dr.  
Cox. 

"Whooping cough," said Dr. Cox..  
"first masquerades as an ordinary 
cold, with running nose and eyeS, 
followed by a slight cough. These 
symptoms develop about I to 14 days 
after exposure. Then in about anoth-
er week the cough develops into a 
series of continued attacks, in an ef-
fort to expel the troublesome mu-
cuous. An attempt to breathe during 
the choking spell produces the char -
acteristic whooping sound. In mild 
cases it may be absent. The whoop-
ing stage lasts 4 to 6 weeks and may 
then take another two or three 
weeks to decline gradually. 

"Here are some facts about 
whooping cough: 

"1. The disease starts like a com-
mon cold, 1 to 14 days after expos-
ure. In about another week the 
cough develops and the whooping us-
ually begins. 

"2. It is one of the communicable 
diteases children often catch at 
school. After a child has reached the 
age of five, fatalities occur less fre 
quently. Children may carry this di-
sease home to babies. 

"3. Most important of all is to see 
that infants are vaccinated against 
whooping cough, for most deaths oc-
cur among children less than -one 
year of age. 

It just had to happen! When America is presented with a 

car—the New Hudson—that is obviously years ahead 

in styling and performance, there's action everywhere! 

And now, from Maine to the western Rockies and be-
yond, Hudson ranks first, second, third or fourth in sales 
among cars in all price classes in markets of all sizes! 

HUDSON A LEADER IN RESALE VALUE! 
National Automobile Dealers Association 
Official Used Car Guide books show step-

down" designed Hudsons commanding top 
prices in the notion's used car markets! 

MTIAT a picture! Hudson sales for the first seven 
onths this year over 30 per cent ahead of 

last year! 

Already more than 114,000 people have switched 
from cars of other makes to own a "step-down" 
designed New Hudson! 

So why shouldn't we join in this surge of success 
with the best deals in our history? 

You're invited to enjoy a Revelation Ride in the 
only car that brings you the most of the four great 

40 YEARS OF 

ENGINEERING LEADERSHIP 

things people want most—beauty, roominess, road-
worthiness, and all-round performance. Yes, it's 
America's 4-Most Car! 
For road-worthiness, as an example, Hudson's 
"step-down" design provides the lowest center of 
gravity in any stock car—yet there's full road 
clearance! Result: the safest, steadiest, hug-the-
road ride ever known! 
Come in, real soon; bring your car along. See how 
much it will bring right now, traded in on a years- ONLY CAR WITH THE STEP ahead New Hudson! 	 DESIGN 

NEW 

HUDSON 
HERE'S WHERE TO COME FOR YOUR REVELATION RIDE 

Hardage Hudson Company 
FARWELL, TEXAS 



rollment has been completed. 
A girl's chorus and general chorus 

also will be organized this fall. The 
men's glee club will continue under 
the direction of Richard Richards, 
instructor of music. 

Merf.ingues baked on hot fillings 
cook more evenly and are less likely 
to "weep" than those baked on a 
cold pie, according to tests made by 
the New York State Experiment Sta-
tion. 

LEGAL NOTICE 
CITATION BY PUBLICATION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: Mrs. Katherine Williams, De-

fendant, Greeting: 
You are hereby commanded to ap-

pear before the Honorable District 
Court of Parmer County at the Court 
House thereof, in Farwell, Texas, at 
or before 10 o'clock A. M. of the first 
Monday next after the expiration of 
forty-two days 'from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same being 
the 14th day of November, A. D. 
1949, then and there to answer Plain-
tiff's Petition filed in said Court, on 
the 26th day of September A. D. 
1949, in this cause, numbered 1486 on 

Trade-hi Sale! 
BEDROOM SUITES 

Beautiful modern limed oak suites in open stock. May be 
bought any way you like. Start with a bed or chest of 
drawers, add to the suite later. Unbelievably low prices on 
this solid oak suite. 

RANCH STYLE BEDROOM FURNITURE.-See our new 
open stock groupings of bedroom furniture. Available in 
seven different finishes. Rustic looking with brands on 
suite, horseshoe handles: Buy one or a dozen pieces in this 
furniture. 
We have dozens of suites to select from. Large blond 
suites with poster or panel bed, chest or chestrobe. Beau-
tiful walnut suite, large poster bed. 

WALNUT BEDROOM SUITE.-Four pieces. Dove-tail 
construction, large plate-glass mirror. You would expect 
this suite to sell at $199.50. Our price 

$139.50 

DINETTES 
We have the largest selection of dinettes of any store our 
size in the country. 
Double leaf extension plastic dinette. 35"x48" extends to 
72". 5 piece set only 

$99.50 
5 piece solid oak dinette. 

$44.50 
Plasitc extension table. 30"x42", extends to 52". 5 piece 
suite. From 

$64.50 
Plastic extension table and tour chairs. 

$49.50 
All plastic suites available in red, blue, tan, grey, green 
and yellow. • 

DINING ROOM SUITES 
Walnut water-fall 8 piece dining room suite. Sixty inch 
buffet, large extension taole, nost chair and live siae 
chairs. A regular $219.50 seller. Our sale price 

$179.50 
Limed oak drop leaf table, two 12-inch extension leaves, 
host chair, five side chairs, buffet, china-9 pieces at this 
unheard of low price 

$219.50 
Solid oak 8 piece dining room suite. 48 inch buffet, exten-
sion table, host chair, five side chairs 

$159.50 
See our beautiful almond-grey dining room suite. The 
most beautiful finish you ever saw. If you don't think it is 
covered with glass, you will be an exception. 8 pieces with 
60 inch buffet, extension table, 6 dining room chairs. Reg;  
ular $199.50. Our sale price 

$169.50 
Same style suite as almond-grey only natural walnut. 

CHILDREN'S 
ROCKERS 

Covered in velours, tapes-
tries, and friezes. Only 

$6.95 

TABLE LAMPS & 
FLOOR LAMPS 

Table lamps from $4.95. 
7-way floor lamps from 

$12.95 

MANTLE 
FIRE PLACES 

Any finish you want. From 

$39.50 

USED FURNITURE AT GREAT SAVINGS 
Frigidaire; 5 ft., guaranteed 79.50 
6 dra\yer chest of drawers.... 12.50 
Ironing board 	  2.00 
Kitchen ranges, gas or butane, 

From 	  5.00 
Kew Perfection oil range 	 5.00 
Kerosene heaters from 	 5.00 
Bates tub 	  20.00 
Rot water tank, automatic, 20 gal- 

lon. Only 	  30.00 
Heating stoves, gas. From 	 4.00 
Round oak tables From 	 4.50 
Electric Washing machines, 

From 	  29.50 

Since we are really doing lots of 
trading, here are some of our bar-
gains in good used furniture: 
F i v e piece solid o a k dinette, 

like new 	  29.50 
5 piece drop leaf dinette,....$ 17.50 
Norge Refrigerator, 

Guaranteed, 	 79.50 
8 piece dining room suite 	 49.50 
8 piece dining room suite 	 69.50 
Two twin size Hollywood head-

boards, box springs, and mat- 
tresses. Just like new 	 89.50 

godern 3 piece bedroom suite 59.50 

4/6 bedsprings From 	 3.95 
Tricycle (Retails new $16.95) 4.50 
Innerspring mattress 	 7.50 
Reversible Chenille rug, 9x12 (good 

shape) 	  15.90 
Wilton weave 12'x13'6", 

like new 	  70.00 
4 piece bedroom mutt, ....... 	49.50 
3/3 Jenny Linn bed 	 17.50 
Metal beds, 4/6 and 3/3 from 4.95 

	

Baby beds     10.00 
3 drawer chest of drawers 	 8.50 
Chest of drawers (dresser base) 

Only 	  4.00 

The Furniture Mart 
Phone 2571 Texico-Farwell BEN 0. SMART Owner 

Since we are the trading-est, swapping-est 
store in our surrounding territory, we invite 
you to bring in your old furniture and trade it 
in on anything we have. Better still, we will 
come out to your house and make a free ap- 
praisal. If we can't save you money, we don't 
want to trade with you. 

LIVING ROOM SUITES 
We have as good a selection of living room furniture as a 
store our size can possibly have. Drop by to see our new 
selection of- living room furniture. Liberal allowance on 
trade-ins. 

Blue frieze 2 piece living room suite. A regular seller at 
$219.50. Priced for this sale at 

$169.50 
Wine velour two piece studio suite. A regular $179.50 
seller. Our sale price - 

$139.50 
Lipstick red velour two piece studio suite. Large channel 
type arms. A regular $199.50 seller. Sale price 

$169.50 
Blue auto mohair two piece studio suite. Large barrel type 
arms. A regular $229.50 suite. Sale price 

$179.50 
Most of all our other living room furniture retluced in 
price 10% to 40 %. Limited space prevents our listing all 
of these bargains. REMEMBER-Liberal allowance on 
your trade-ins. 	 • 

CARPETING 
We have just received a 
new shipment of carpet-
ing. See these beautiful 
patterns today. Priced 
from . 

$5.95 
Per Square Yard 

PLATFORM 
ROCKERS 

We have a large selection 
of platform rockers. Re-
duced i n price 10% t o 
59%. These rockers are 
priced to move. 

LINOLEUM 
The best stock in months. 12 ft. 
and 9 ft. Dining room & kitch- 
en patterns. Plenty of rugs. 

WINTERIZE 
YOUR 
CAR 
NOW 

HARDAGE 
HUDSON 

COMPANY 

ENGINE 
ChaxAge Engine Oil 
New Oil Filter 
Engine Tune-up 
Clean Carbureator and Fuel 

lines 
New Fan Belt 
New Spark Plugs 
qew Distributor Points 
Cooling System, Flush and 

clean 
Grind Valves 
New Piston Rings 

BODY 
Remove Dents-Body and fen- 

ders 
Clean Upholstery 
install Seat Covers.. 
Replace Floor Mats 
Adjust Body Bolts 
Tighten Bumpers 
Remove Door and Window 

Rattles 
Replace Wiper Blades 
Check All Lights 

CHASSIS 
Chassis Lubrication 
Repack _Universal Joints 

(every 10,000 miles) 
Adjust, Repack Wheel Bear- 

ings 
Check Front Wheel Alignment 
inspect and Rotate Tires 
Repair Shock Absorbers 
Reline Brakes 
Reface Clutch 
Adjust and Tighten Steering 
Recharge Battery 

g • 
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!Cottonseed Reports Are 
Available To Growers 

plained. 
The cottonseed report may be ob-

tained by writing local USDA cotton 
classing offices, or Mr. McCollum at 
1104 South Ervay St., Dallas, 1, Tex. 
	0 	 

Great Things Expected 
Of New Tech Chorus 

the docket of said court and styled 
Doris Williams, Plaintiff, vs. Kath-
erine Williams, Defendant. 

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit is as follows, to-wit: 

Plaintiff alleges that he married 
defendant November 10, 1948, and 
because of the excesses, cruel treat-
ment and outrages administered to 
him by the defendant, their further 
living together was rendered insup-
portable. That no child issued from 
said union and marriage and there 
is no community property. Plaintiff 
prays for judgment for absolute di-
vorce from defendant, as is more 
fully shown by Plaintiff's Petition 
on file in this suit. 

The Officer executing this process 
shall promptly execute the same ac-
cording to law, and make due return 
as the law directs. 

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at office 
in Farwell, Texas, this the 26th day 
of September, A. D.1949. 

Attest: 
LOYDE A. BREWER, Clerk, 

District Court, Parmer Coun-
ty, Texas. 
By: Rosa Lee Tabor, Deputy. 

(SEA_L) 
50-4to 

LUBBOCK-Before too king, Tex-
ans should be hearing great things 
about the Tetras Technological Col-
lege mixed chorus of 40 voices. That's 
the, aim of Prof. Gene Hemmle, new-
ly-appointed head of the music de-
partment who has become one of the 
southviest's outstanding authorities 
on choral music. 

Dr. Hemmle is returning to Texas 
after having completed work on a 
Ph. D. at Columbia University. He 
was head of the music department at 
Texas Western University from 1946-
1948. 

"We hope to make the mixed cho-
rds a touring group which will visit 
Texas.  cities throughout the school 
year," Dr. Hemmle said. 

He explained that all Texas Tech 
students will be eligible for member-
ship on the mixed chorus. Tryouts 
will get underway shortly after en- 

• COLLEGE STATION - Cotton 
*rowers were urged today to write 
for the free cottonseed market news 
reports issued by the PMA;  USDA's 
southwest cotton office at Dallas. 

According to John McCollum, area 
manager, many cotton growers are 
nct making full use of this report 
rnd in certain cases thep are not re-
ceiving maximum returns for their 
cc nom:cede He pointed out that un-
like many other agricultural pro-
ducts, there are no organized mark-
ets to provide basic cottonseed infor-
mation. Therefore, farmers are en-
tirely dependent upon local quota-
ticns with no basis for compariasns 
unless they receive these reports. . 

Current cottonseed prices are ga-
thered by PMA from ginners and 
cotton oil mills. 

McCollum said cotton growers par-
ticularly need this cottonseed market 
information this year since the CCC 
has a cottonseed • loan program in 
operation. These reports will help 
growers determine whether it would-
be more profitable for them to place 
their seed in loan or sell it, he ex- 

PONTIFF AND HIS AMERICAN VISITORS . . . Pope Pius XII rests 
at his summer residence at Castelgondolfo. Italy, and receives as 
visitors two Catholic church dignitaries from the United States. They 
are Edward Cardinal Mooney (left), Detroit, and Samuel Cardinal 
Stritch (right), Chicago. They visited the pontiff during their "ad 
Lingua" visit to the Eternal City. 

TRIBUNE ADS BRING HOME THE BACON 



The Biggest State Fair in the World 
STATE MR OF TEXAS 

121 W. 4th St. Clovis, N. M. 
Across From Postoffice 

• - WE'LL UBE 
YOUR OLD SOFA 

Pas/04  
Good as new? It's better than 

new! Upholstering saves you 

dollars, gives you the effect of 

totally new and beautiful furni-

ture at a modest cost. 

PEEWEE STEWART & JESS LATHAM 
At Hardage Hudson Co. 

For A Quick Dinner 
Modern science has gone a long way in relieving the 

housewife in the preparation of tasty meals for her fam-
ily. 

Visit our frozen food box. Here you will find a va-
riety of garden-fresh vegetables, fruits, desserts, and fish 
that will make a complete, appetizing meal for any fam-
ily. 

COMBS & VENABLE GROCERY & MARKET 

ROVINA. TEXAS Ph. 2221 

The soh non-glare satin-finish gives 
an attractive charm to walls, ceilings 
and woodwork. 

Smart, matching color effects can be 
made with BPS Identically Matched 
Colon of FLATLUX and GLOS-WX 

ask for descriptive folder. 

Here are some of the Out:rand. 
Ins features of SATIN-LUX: 
• Brushes on easity..dries quickly 

• Hard, satin-smooth finish 

• Stays clean longer..saves work 

• New, beautiful pastel colors 

• For walls, ceiling, woodwork 

• Hand-rubbed effect on Furnl 
tura 

• Covers plaster,wood,wailboard 
• Washing will not harm the finish 

• Economical . . long wearing. 

Cicero Smith Lumber Co. 
Bovina, Texas 

%4 &eta */ WALLS crud WOODWORK House Paint 

Super White Enamel 

Rapidry Enamel 

Outside Trim Paint 

Barn Paint 

WALLPAPER 

We carry the most complete 

line of wallpaper shown in 

Parmer County. 

See The New Patterns 

GAINES IlDW. CO 

Bovina Texas 	Ph. 2301 

tte56 Health for All. 
tfalrillits 
tbis Fan! 	co-  itts.2 

* For Cold Preventiln - Greater Resistance 

BOVINA DRUG STORE 
Bovina, Texas 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

Charles Don Smith who is attend-
ing school in Lubbock spent the past 
weekend here visiting his parents. 

Mr. Lid Mrs. Graham Thornton of 
Farwell spent the past weekend in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. N. E. 
Bonds 

MrS. George Reisinger is spending 
v:eek in Hereford visiting the 

Ho6ker family. 

School was dismissed Friday so 
r'''eryone could go to the Fair in Fri-
ona. 

r. and Mrs. Trillus Pattcn of 
Dimmitt, visited in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. L.. C. Moore, Sunday even-
ing of last week. The Pattons and the 
Moores were old friends from Elec-
tra, Texas, several years ago. 

Mrs. Ross Terry of Friona visited 
in the Charlie Jefferson home Satur-
day. . 

Miss Sarah Venable and Miss Dor-
othy Wilkerson were Clovis shoppers 
Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Glover and 
son, Ellison, and Miss Patsy Loflin, 
spent the past weekend in Jal, N. 
M., visiting with the Ausburne Lof-
lin family and the Harry Jeffersons. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Jefferson and 
daughters visited Mrs. Jefferson?:  
parents in Clovis, Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hromas and 
daughters returned Wednesday from 
a two weeks vacation in California 
where they have been visiting rela-
tives and friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hop Graham and 
daughter, Sammie, of Farwell visited 
in Bovina, Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Brown and 
family moved to Clovis where he is 

Eubanks, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Mont-
gomery, Mr. and Mrs. Henry Minter, 
Rev. and Mrs. Weldon Franks and 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hawkins. 

employed in a shoe shop. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Bob Alverson 

moved into the Gaines rent house 

this week after remodeling the inter-

ior. 

`SAM HOUSTON'S STRANGE 

ROMANCE" * • • She hadn't been 

married 48 hours when Eliza Allen 

wished her husband dead! Why did 
Sam Houston choose to take the se-
cret of his estrangement to the 

grave? Don't miss this exciting story 

in the American Weekly, that great 

magazine distributed with next Sun-

day's Los Angeles Examiner. 
• 

rribune want ads get results. 

Bovina 
happenings 

BY MARIE VENABLE 

BENEFIT POLIO DANCE HELD 

The American Legion sponsored a 
March of Dimes dance Saturday 

I night with all the proceeds going to 
the Polio Drive. The American Leg-
ion Post 518 of Bovina takes this 
means to iak the ones who helped 
with this matter and especially the 
musicians who donated their time 

land efforts free for this worthy cause 
$84.85 was taken in with all going to 
the March of Dimes. 

KID PARTY ENJOYED 

The Pal's Class of the First Bap-
tist ,church was entertained with a 
kid party, Friday night at Typton 
Eubanks farm in the barn north of 
Bovina. All attendants reported an 
enjoyable time. Attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. J. W. Gooch, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. L. Kerby, Mr. and Mrs. Typton 

SEW AND CHATTER CLUB MEETE 

Members of the Sew and Chatter 
Club held their first business and 
social meeting of the new year on 
September 21st, in the home of Mrs. 
A. M. Wilson at 3 p. m. Mrs. Emmitt 
Tabor was co-hostess. 

A business meeting followed the 
dinner. Members attending were as 
follows: 

Mesdames Jack Berggren, Robert 
Calaway, Jessie Walling. Pete Dav-
ies, T. G. Hudson, Jr., Paul Jones, 
Joe Wilson, Otis White and Byron 
Turner. 

The next meeting will be in the 
home of Mrs. Jessie Walling, Sept-
ember 29th. 
	0 	 

START TIE DAY RIGHT 

Send children to school ready to 
work and to play—well-rested, and 
well-fed. See that they start the day 
right with a good breakfast. 

Mustang 
Bovina, Texas 

WEDNESDAY-THURSDAY 

Bride Of Vengeance 

FRIDAY-SATURDAY 

The Fighting Vigilantes 

DR. ABNER ROBERTS 
OPTOMETRIST 

We Feature the Most Modern Frames 
Correct Examinations 

Prompt Lens Replacement Service 

Come In Now 

Mr. Hubert McKenney sustained a 
broken leg Wednesday afternoon 
when he was loading a refrigerator 
at the Elliott 'Hardware where he 
ovals employed. he was rushed to tho 
Clovis hospital and is reported to be 
resting well. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Langer made a 
business trip to Amarillo, Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Gray were 
called to Oklahoma this week due to 
death of Mrs. Gray's mother. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bass Elliott purchas-
ed a new Pontiac Saturday. 

Mrs. Charlie Calaway received 
medical care in Clovis, Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Ellison made a 
business trip to Amarillo, Saturday. 

Miss Martha Williams, Miss Deloris 
Wilson, Jerry Jones, Fred Hoffer, 
Jack Barnett all were home from col-
lege in Canyon the past weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Peters and daughters 
of Amarillo spent the past weekend 
visiting Mrs. Peters' parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Carson. 

The Four Square Dance Club Met 
Thursday night at a regular session 
at the Legion hall with a good at-
tendance. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Trimble pur-
chased a new Chevrolet this past 
week. 

The Veterans Agriculture class at-
tended the Fair in Friona, Friday. 

Mr. Paul Smith left the past week 
to attend school in Austin, Texas. 

Miss Patsy Ellison who is in nurses 
training in Lubbock visited her par-
ents here the past weekend, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buck Ellison. 

Mr. Henry Minter and Mr. Jack 
Kessler made a business trip to Clo-
vis, Saturday. ' r  • 

Mr. and Mrs. Ezra Englant and 
daughter, Mary Alice, left Saturday 
for Farmington, N. ‘M., to take Mrs. 
Englant's mother to visit her daugh-
ter there for a few weeks. 

SUND AY-MONDAY-TUESD AY 

Connecticutt Yankee 
Also NEWSREEL COOK'S 

PAINTS 

LOANS! 

Farm — Ranch — City 
LIBERAL APPRAISALS—I OW INTroTEST 
LONG TERM— PREPAYMENT PRIVILEGES 

ETHRIDGE-SPRING AGENCY 
BILL LILES 

• Papering 
• Painting 
• Sheet rock Finishing, 
• Textone 

Interior and Exterior 

Dan Ethridge 	Frank A. Spring 
	

Bill Stewart 
Friona, Texas 
	

Dial 2121 

Bovina, Texas 

WINDMILL WORK 

Reasonable Rates 

Work Guaranteed 

Go Anywhere 

Pete Davies 
Bovina, Texas 

Seed 241 heat 
We have a good supply of common 

and certified seed wheat in the following 

varieties: 

• COMMANCHE 

• TENMARQ 

• WESTAR 

• WICHITA 

SHERLEY GRAIN CO. 
BOVINA, TEXAS 

HEATERS 	HEATERS 
AND MORE HEATERS 

We Have Them in Natural or Butane Gas 

• SPACE HEATERS 

• CIRCULATOR HEATERS 
• WALL HEATERS 
• AUTOMATIC HEATERS 

AT BARGAIN PRICES 

Roper, Tappan, Magic Chef 
And Other Gas Ranges 

American Kitchen Sink and Cabinets 
Kroehler Furniture Made To Order 

Sealey Mattresses 

Frigidaire Refrigerators and Home Freezers 

C. R. Elliott Company 
BOVINA, TEXAS 

Charles Oil Company 
Wholesale and Retail 

WE DELIVER. ANYTIME, ANYWHERE 

WASH AND GREASE CARS 

Your Business Earnestly Solicited and Appreciated 

DISTRIBUTORS OF PHILLIPS 66 

H. J. CHARLES, Prop. 

Phone 2331 	 BovIna, Texas 



"How did your wife get on with 
her slimming diet? 

"Fine—she disappeared corn- 
pletely last week? 	 0 

. • • 

Father: "Say, it's 2 o'clock. Do 
you think you can stay all night?" 

Suitor: 	have to telephone 
home first." 

. • * 
Father: "Did you give Rita that 

.opy of 'What Every Girl Should 
(now'?" 

Mother of Co-Ed: "Yes, and 
she's writing a letter to the au-
thor suggesting the addition of 
three new chapters." 

* • * 

Before your evening drive stop 
in at our service station for a 
safety checkup on your car. Your 
ridp will be pleasanter. 

POP SPURLIN'S 66 
STATION 

Farwell 	 Texas 

The Time to Build Is NOW! 
Your dream of a home can become a reality. Construction 

and material costs are down ... all grades of money-

saving lumber are again available ... there are no expen-

sive delays. More reasons than ever why a home of your 

own is the most satisfying investment you can make... 

an investment in a wood-built home means relatively 

higher resale value in the future. 

And, as with any investment, you'll want the counsel 

of a firm qualified to assist with details. All the members 

af our organization stand ready and willing to help yoa 

... build your home NOW ! 

Houston Lumber 
Company 

E. M. Roop, Mgr. 

Phone 3721 Texico, New Mexico 

THE STATE LINEITRIBUNE 

"BOON TO BABIES" • • • Par-
ents! Here's encouraging news of 
how doctors are saving thousands of 
infants each year from the often fa-
tal danger of diarrhea. Don't miss 
important medical report on these 
new drugs. It's in The American 
Weekly, the great magazine distribu-
ted with next Sunday's Los Angeles 
Examiner, 

Ground Broken for New Palsy Treatment Center at Lubbock 

engagement, animal cages will be on 
display at the show grounds at 10 a. 
m. for free inspection by the public. 
Dolly Jacobs will have her elephants 
down-town at noon circus day at the 
Texaco Service Station in Texico. 

Teubel Is Chairman 
Of District 5 USO 

areas in Texas, New Mexico, and Col-1  
orado, extending southeast 500 miles  

I
to Cuero, Texas, and north about 325 
miles to Holly, Colorado. 

Cases coming to the Center are 
referred by their local physicians or 
by orthopedic specialists. During the 
last year 102 physicians referred ca• 
ses for care at the Center. 

Facilities of the Treatment Center 
are available to all cases in need of 
care. The next clinic for the exami-
nation of patients will be held Mon-
day, November 14, with Dr. C. B. 
Sadler, Amarillo, and Dr. E. T. Dris-
coll, Plainview, examining patients. 

Parents are requested to register 
children at tne Center at some time 
before the clinic date. Further in-
formation may be obtained by writ-
ing Dr. E. E. Snell, director, or by 
calling Lubbock 6541. 

A ground breaking ceremony for 
the new $42,000 cerebral palsy Treat-
ment Center was held Wednesday, 
September 21 at the time of the reg- 
ularly scheduled meeting of the Lub-
bock Rotary Club, co-sponsors of the 
project. 

The new building, to be located at 
34th Street and Avenue M in Lub-
bock, will be a one story masonry 
construction providing facilities for 
physical therapy, occupational ther-
apy and speech therapy for the cere-
bral palsied. 

The Treatment Center, at present 
located at 1317 Tenth Street in Lub-
bock, completed its first year of op-
eration on August 22. During the 

year 202 cases of cerebral palsy were 
registered fur treatment and 2997 
treatments were given. Seven clinics 
were held at approximately two 

• 
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Ninety-eight thousand of our own 
young men and women from Texas 
are now in uniform, and it is up to 
us one and all to keep up their ties 
with home, so that they may return 
to us as happy and useful citizens," 
he continued. "The best way to do 
this is through USO, which is on the 
scene to serve them whether they 
are stationed at some military es-
tablishment here in the United 
States or at an overseas outpost. 

"The USO provides the thousands 
of veterans in Army, Navy and Vet-
erans hospitals with regular profess-
ional entertainment, and the fre-
quent reminder so valuable to their 
morale that neither they nor their 
heroic deeds have been forgotten. 

'If our young people tcan give up 
valuable years out of their lives in 
the defense of their country, we ci-

, viliens at home certainly can show 
our gratitude :,rid our support by 
way of the USO," he concluded. 

0 	 
Buy a bond every pay day! 

Henry Teubel of Tulia, has been 
named District 5 chairman of the 
Texas USO Reactivation campaign, 
T. E. Braniff, state campaign chair-
man, announced today. 

The district headed by Teubel in-
cludes Parmer, Castro and Swishes 
counties. 

The Texas campaign will raise 
$500,000 toward the national goal of 
$10,100,000 for USO, Teubel said. 

"The cold war continues," he de-
clared, "and our people have called 
for a big Army, Navy and Air Force 
• so that our country will be ready to 
meet any pressures from the enemy. 

To Town For One Show 

month intervals with two orchoped- Hey, Kids! Circus Comes ists specializing in the care of the 
cerebral palsied present to examine 
the patients each month. 

One fourth of the cases treated 
during the past year were two years 
of age or less is registered. The 
youngest child registered was five 
:months of age. 

- 	Cases came to the Treatment Cen- 
ter from 80 towns and surrounding 

The elephants, the clown and the 
red wagons are coming! 

The above announcement is being 
hailed with delight by the juvenile 
element, while some of the "older 
boys" are already thinking up some 
excuse to be on hand when the all 

Introducing Our NEW 

Post Card Statement 

41P 

Farwell Real Estate 
& Commission Co. 

Dick Dosher — Jack Spurlin 

MUTUAL HAIL INSURANCE 

REAL ESTATE 

AUCTION SALES 

Phone 2501 
	

Farwell, Texas 

Your  next Public Service Company statement will come to 

to you in post card form. 

Wherever you live, simply continue to make your 

payment where you always have. You'll find the address of 

the office at which you pay your statement across the top of 

this new post card form. 

SOUTHWESTERN 

PUBLIC SERVICE 
COMPANY 

25 YEARS OF GOOD CITIZENSHIP AND PUBLIC SERVICE 

cEva,•r•th • • 	 

new Stevens Brothers Circus and 
menagerie pitch their tents in Tex-
ico for one performance at 2 p. m. on 
Sunday, October 2nd. 

Many new and novel features will 
be seen in this season's program, 
foremost of which will be Dolly Ja-
cobs world-famous trained elephants, 
three herds..of the largest elephants 
traveling with any motorized show; 
Sanchez Family, a recent importa-
tion from Mexico, in acrobatic and 
wire numbers; DeKohl Trio, Europe-
an jugglers; Riggs Trio, comedy bar 
act; Neilson Sisters on the high tra-
peze: Virginia Lynne, sensational 
equilibrist; Paul Benjamo and his 
troupe of clowns; Bob Grubbs' liber-
ty horses; "Oklahoma Shorty" and, 
his troupe of trick riders and ropers; 
Stevens Brothers prancing ponies, 
riding dogs and monkeys, always a 
treat for the children; all combined 
with what is said to be the largest 
collection' of wild animals carried by 
any motorized circus. 

Popular prices will prevail for this 

Code: ARS- Mints IAOS • ItIerchantlIse at • Eletitleal 
	-*get 

Bills Are Due an d Pa)able W hen 
Rendered 

Please Bring Card When 
Paying at 

Office 



License Issued 
__Lorain& to racards at the office 

of County Clerk Loyde Brewer, a 
marriage license has been issued to 
Waymon Wilkins of Friona and Miss 
Joyce Ann Jones, of Portales, en Fri-
day, September 23rd. 

In Ezell Home 
Visitors in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. Roy B. Ezell the past Friday 
were their daughter, Mrs. Eugene 
Parker and Nancy Hults, 5-year-old 
great-granddaughter of the Ezells. 
both from Roswell. 

In Moore Home 
Mrs. Edith Pilcher of Frederick, 

Okla., is visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Moore in Texico, while 
enroute to her home after a trip t9 
California. 

The Farwell Steers, who have thus 
far staged all their 1949 gridiron 
skirmishes at home, will take to the 
road on Friday of this week, bekng 
slated to play the Hale Center squad 
there at 8 that night. 

This will be the third conference 
match of the season, with the Steers 
having two nice black marks for 
victoires over the Friona Chiefs and 
the Whitharral Panthers. 

Coach Louis Purvis reported the 
first of the week that Donald Ford, 
stellar end, would likely be out of 
action this weekend, having receiv-
ed a ruptured blood vessel on the 
calf of his right leg. To Carey Joe 
Magness will go the thankless task 
of trying to fill Ford's shoes at the 
end slot, it was indicated. 

Other members of the team, the 
coach indicated, will be ready to do 
battle again on Friday night. 

Scouts report that Friona played 
Hale Center an exceptionally close 
ball game last weekend, losing only 
in the last quarter, and this makes 
things look pretty' good for the lo-
cals, who slammed the Chiefs down 
recently. In comparative scores, Far-
well beat Friona 26-6, while Hale 
Center out-pointed the Chiefls 26-12 
in their game. 

Yearling Schedule Is 
Changed By Coach . 

CANYON—WTSC freshman foot-
ball team will open a five-game sea-
son in Lubbock, Friday, September 
30, against the Texas Tech first-year 
team. Coach Borden Price has been 
sending 35 frosh hopefuls through 
workouts here since September 1 
and prospects are rated the best in 
the history of the school. 

The schedule is as follows: 
Sept. 30—Texas Tech, day, Lub-

bock. 
Oct. 6—Sandia Air Base, night, 

Canyon. 
Oct. 29—New Mexico U. Frosh, 

day, Canyon. 
Nov. 4—Hardin-Simmons Frosh, 

day, Abilene. 
Nov. 19—Texas Tech frosh, day, 

Canyon. 

only 
makes the 

loveliest room 
'you've ever seen! 

per gallon. 
one gallon 

7 

Frank Seale Equip. Co. 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

To Santa Fe FOR RENT—Bedroom, accessable to 
bath. J. P. Doose, Texico. 	60-3tp 

Mrs. Carson Meets 
With PTA Unit 

Steers Take To Road 
For Weekend Game 

9 

Mrs. Raymon Carson, president of 
Lamb County PTA council, met with 
the Lazbuddy PTA unit, Monday 
night to discuss the advantages of 
joining the congress of PTA. The 29 
members present voted to join the 
congress. 

It was decided to have a member-
ship drive, with a prize of $5 going 
to the room which brings in the lar-
gest percentage of members, both in 
grade school and high school 

The next meeting will be on Mon-
day night, Oct. 3, at 8 o'clock. All 
residents of the community are urg-
ed to attend. 

• ••••• 

,Attend Jamboree _ 
Mr. and Mrs. John Porter and Mr. 

and Mrs. Mose Glasscock attended 
the "Barn Dance Jamboree" which 
was held in Littlefield the past Sat-
urday night. Mrs. Porter also visited 
with her mother, Mrs. Davis, during 
the day. 

Attend Tea Sunday 
Mrs. Lura Rundell, Mrs. Woody 

McDermitt and Mrs. John Porter at-
tended a tea held in Hereford from 
3 until 6, Sunday afternoon, at the 
Eastera Star meeting, honoring Mrs. 
Bell Hromas, of Hereford, who is the 
State Deputy Grand Matron of Tex-
as OES. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Drace and child-
ren ,of Abernathy, were weekend 
guests in the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Moore, in Texico. 

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Cummings and 
on, of Friona, were Sunday visitors 
n the home of her parents, Mr. and 
rs. C. A. Cassady. 

HOUSE WINS PRIZE 

AUSTIN—A house designed by 
two • young University .of Texas ar-
hiteciture graduates, Jack Hillmer 
nd Robert Warren Callister, nas 
von them international recognition. 
Both "Life" magazine and the 

`Architectural Forum" featured the 
louse in recent issues. 

Hillmer and Callister graduated 
rom the University's School of Ar-
:thitecture in 1941, are now practic- 
ng 	San Francisco. 

Firing upon Ft. Sumter in April, 
861 was the first military act of the 
civil War. 

Mrs. Louis Caillouet and daughter 
left Saturday for Santa Fe, N. M.. 
where they plan an extended visit 
with Mr. Caillouet, who is employed 
on a road construction gang near 
that city. 

In Porter Home 
Mr. and Mrs. David Mitchell and 

daughters of Whitharral, were visit-
ors in the home of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Porter the past Friday afternoon. 
The Porters and their guests attend-
ed the football game here Friday 
night between Farwell and Whithar-
ral. The two ladies are sisters. 

• 2 	. • i 	. 	. - 	• 
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GOOD WHEAT LAND  
SECTION, Close in on pavement, top 

quality, all in cultivation. $80. 
558 A., Adjoins town site, on pave-

ment, 400 A. in cultivation. $60. 
320 A., Two miles east 	Bovina on 

pavement, 110 A. sowed to wheat, 
$65. 

320 A., One mile from pavement, all 
in cultivation. All plowed and rea-
dy for wheat. $80. 

160 A., On pavement, all in cultiva-
tion, all in raw crop. $75. 

960 A., All in grass, a 	beauty for 
small, ranching, or about half of it 
would be nice farm land. $35. 

0. W. RHINEHART 
Bovine. Texas 

FOR SALE OR TRADE—Two 4- 
room, modem apartment house. 

Located at 720 Sycamore in Clovis. 
Would like to trade 	for house in 
Farwell, or will sell outright. Phone 
4208, Clovis. 	 47-3tp 

FR 

fold, 
copdition, 

SALE—Four-bin granary with 
driveway between bins, in good 

to be moved. Chas. Luns- 
Farwell. Phone 2097. 	47-3tp 

F4
R 

w411. 

necessary 
WiatkinS, 

SALE—Tenmarq seed wheat, 
ree from Johnson grass and not 

	

 	to reclean, 240 bu. G. T. 
7 '/ 	miles north east Far- 

50-3tp 

F4R SALE-1949 Massey-Harris 14' 
21.6 duale, lights, etc. $3500 if tak- 
ni immediately. Wade Implement Co. 
Sweetwater, Texas. 	50-3tp 

WANTED—Ironing to do. Mrs. W. L. 
Roberts. 	Inquire Border 	Service 

Service Station Texico. 	50-3to 

FOR SALE—Twenty young Jersey 
cows in milk; one' Allis-Chalmers 

combine, 2 miles east, 1 mile north 
of Friona. Clyde Sherrieb, Box 243, 
Phone 2934. 	 50-2tp 

FOR SALE-26 crossties, 25c each if 
you take all. R. L. Edwards, Bovi- 

na, Box 921. 	 50-4tp 

and 
To 

SUBSCRIPTIONS WANTED—Mar- 

your 

lication 
mail 
Texas. 
Publisher 
formation 

shall 	Deaton—a 	shut-in—solicits 
"new" and "renewal' magazine 

	

newspaper subscriptions. 	. 	. 
order: Simply write title of pub-

wanted on a postal card and 
to: 	Marshall 	Deaton, 	Black, 
Marshall will gladly furnish 

prices and any other in- 
desired. Thanks! 	47-tfc 

PIPE 

modes, 
nails, 
stretchers 
white 
$3.25 
water 

AND PIPE FITTINGS, bath 
tubs, 	windows, 	showers, 	com- 

	

plumbing 	supplies, 	bolts, 
25 ft. garden hose $3.50, wire 

$3.25, 	hammers, cheap, 
paint 	$2.75 	gal., 	linseed 	oil 

gal., rough lumber $7.00, hot.  
heaters, 	drawer knifes, 	log 

hoists. Few chain 	 as good— chains, 
none 
phens, 
Sheldon 

better. The Monitor. 	See Ste- 
the Rough Lumber Man, 120 

St., Clovis. 	44-tfc 

HEAVY DUTY Waterproof Tractor 
binder canvas. 3-inch webb belting 

leather ends. One Case G, and one 
M-M 9 row crop combine, terms to 
fall harvest. Consumers.Supply, Clo- 
vis, N. M. 	 46-4tc 

FOR SALE, TRADE or RENT-3- 
bedroom 	home 	in 	Farwell, 	3 

bocks from school. Also 2-bedroom 
home and garage apartment in Texi- 
co. H. H. Henson, Texico. 	48-3tp 

1/2. 

FOR SALE—One of the best stock 

cres, 
ment—good 
windmill, 
cultivation, 
$67.50 

farms in Parmer County. 1035 a-
on rural electric line and pave- 

modem home, 	well 
outbuildings, 400 acres in 

1 irrigation well. Price, 
acre, can give terms on about 

M. A. Crum, Friona, Tex. 47-3tp 

FOR SALEtwo-door Chevro- -1940 

$550. 
age, 

let, 	far above 	average. 	Priced 
L. B. Eubanks, Baptist parson- 

Lazbuddy. 	 48-3tp 

FOR 

fenced, 
per 
land. 
FOR 

Quickel, 

SALE-11/2  section good grass 
land, south part Deaf Smith Co.' 

well and windmill. Price, $3F 
acre. See us for farm and ranch 
M. A. Crum, Friona, Tex. 48-2tc 
SALE-2-wheel trailer, in good 

shape, with good 	tires. 	Wilfred 
Farwell. 	 48-3tc 

FOR SALE—Three-room house near 
Farwell. Will sell on lot or to be 

moved. Inquire at 	The 	Furniture 
Mart or phone Jim Bob Smart, Far- 
well, 3086. 	 49-tfc 

HOUSEMOVING—We do all kinds 
of housemoving. No job too large 

or too small. See R. C. (Ted) Jones. 
408 Calhoun St., Clovis, N. M. Ph. 
3544. 	 47 tic 

FOR SALE—Westar seed wheat. Or- 
iginal seed certified 	from Clem 

Kellog, Stinette, Tex. Grown on fal-
lowed sod land, subject to certifica- 
tion. No Johnson grass. 	Dale 	Mc- 
Cuan, Box 33, Farwell, Tex. 	47-3tp 

FOR 	SALE-1949 	two-ton 	Ford 
truck, also 1949 model 15-ft self- 

propelled 	combine—both 	in good 
condition. At the Shanks Ivy Place, 
4 miles north of Lazbuddie store. 

46-6tp 

BORDER 

COME TO CLOVIS 
RET TOR FUN 

EARN RIP IT 
DANCE Min' 

Approaching Nuptials 
Are Revealed Here 

24.r. and Mrs. W. N. Foster, of Far-
well, announce the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Barbara, to George Harold 
Trimble, son of Mr. and Mrs. G. F. 
Trimble, of Bovine: 

The ceremony will take place in 
the Bovina Methodist Church, Oct. 
23, at 3 o'clock. The public is invited 
to attend. 

RETURN HOME FRIDAY 
Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Booth returned 

home Friday, bringing with them 
their yonmg great-granddaughter, 
Tracey Lee McDaniel, of Lubbock, to 
spend a week. The Booths left sever-
al days ago, taking their grand-
daughter, Miss Rosamond Booth, to 
enter college in Denton, Texas, and 
continued their outing to Dallas, for 
a visit with relatives, and. a business 
trip to Shreveport, La. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Sanderson, Mr. 
and Mrs. Orval Powell of Levelland 
and Eugene Savage of Portales, visi-
ted briefly in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Bob Smart, Sunday after-
noon. 

THURSDAY-FRIDAY 

BRIMSTONE 
Also NEWSREEL 

Miss Twila Strickland and Miss 
Ruth Williams of Lubbock, were 
weekend visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Humble over the 
weekend. 

Les Means spent the past Friday 
in Plainview attending to businses 
matters, and stayed overnight in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Tem-
pleman, of that city. 

Mrs. Howard Ellison of Bovina 
spent Monday visiting in the home 
of Mrs. N. W. Peyton in Texico. 

Harry Jesko returned to his home 
here the past Friday night after 

several weeks in Chicago 
and other Illinois points with rela-
tives. 

SATURDAY ONLY 

PURSUED 

SUNDAY-MONDAY 

Gone With The Wind 

Attempting to get matches "more 
in the class of our junior boys", 
Coach Shelby Jobes said on Monday 
that he had re-arranged the sched-
ule of games for the Farwell Year-
lings for the remainder of the sea-
son. 

The locals played Dimmitt there 
last Thursday night bowing to a 
heavier and more experienced squad. 
35-0. 

Reviewing the outlook today, the 
coach said that Farwell will play ..thc. 
Friona juniors here on October 13th 
r ana will go to Friona on October 27 
to return the game. On Thursday of 
this week, September 29, the Little 
field grade school players are slated ' 

I to come here for match. 
Lineup for the past Thursday in-

eluded Magness at left end, Dollar at 
left tackle, Pipkin at left guard, Dan-
iels at center, Cassady at right gaurd 
Jesko at right tackle, Jordan at the 
end arid Dial, Genies, Dosher and 
Gulley in the backfiedl. 

Freshmen Plan Five 
Game Season, 49 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Mears and 
daughter, Georgie Lee, visited with 
relatives in Vernon last weekend. 

Mrs. H. Ross and Mrs. Mae Means 
spent the past Saturday night in the 
home of Mrs. Clara Green in San 
Jun, N. M. 

TUESDAY-WEDNESDAY 

A Night At The Opera 

Herh Greqfierson 
World Famous 

Square Dance Authority 

SQ9 ARE' DANCE 
ROUND-UP 

t irl'ays of Lestons 
2 Nights of Dancing 

During 
Clovis Cattle Festival 

Clovis, N. Mex. 
Cattle Capitol of 

Southwest 
Monday and Tuesday 

Oct. 3 & 4, 1949 
- For Tickets 

Writer, wire, phone or 
call 

Clovis Chamber of 
Commerce 

Extra Attraction 
KEN BAKER'S 

'HELL DRIVERS' 
Risking their necks 

for your entertainment 

Parmer County Bureau Farm Federation 

We ens:pa. 
I 

Continued gas tax rebate 
farm trucks. 

Continued price support 
ties at parity or 

III 

Greater use of rural 
phones. 

4frid Rentende4. 
PRESSURE GROUPS 

LEGISLATION CONTRARY 

YOUR INTERESTS 

"In union there is strength." 

than 300 members 

WATCH 
FOR ORGANIZATION 

JOIN! 

II 

90% 

ARE 

in 

for 

electricity 

• • 	• 
for tractors and 

farm commodi- 
of parity. 

and tele- 

• . 
INFLUENCING 

TO 

... Already more 

Parmer County 

DAY . . . OCT. 21 
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I'M GOING OUT 
FOR FOOTBALL 
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ME TOO, 

BET I BEAT 
YOU OUT 

AT TACKLE 
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r  I'LL OUTGROW OH YEAH?I'M 
YOU ON THE 	A STRAIGHT 
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Up to 1/3  MORE PORK  

from the same amount of 
Balance your grain with Purina 
Hog  Chow instead of tankage, 
bean oil meal and other single 
ingredient supplements. Come 
and see about the Purina 

Farmers Supply Co. 
Phone 3701 

FARWELL. TEXAS 
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OUR SPECIALS 
SUN MAID RAISINS 
15 oz. pkg. 	  

MILK—Carnation or Pet 
Tall can, 2 for 	  

SKINNER'S SPAGHETTI 
Per pkg. 	  

JELLO All flavors 
Three pkgs. for 	  

CHOCOLATE SYRUP 
Hershey's, 1 lb. can 	  

OLEOMARGARINE 
Colored, in t pound cubes, per pound 	 

WEINERS 
Per pound 	  

PORK & BEANS 
White Swan, 1 pound can, 2 for 	 

20c 

25c 

10c 

23c 

16c 

39` 

45c 

19c 

Bakery  Crawley'S Grocery  
Phone 3071—We Deliver 

TEXICO, N. M. 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

NEW SHIPMENT ... 

ROSEDALE 

POTTERY 'Wilkins-Jones Rites Are 
Read Sunday in Friona 

received the 
collection of 

we have ever 
sin and see 

We have just 
most attractive 
Rosedale vases 
shown.. Come 
them.. 

Murray-Hamm Services 
Are Held in Arizona 

Outstanding among the late sum-
mer nuptials was the recent marriage 
of Miss Zoeleen Zelda Murray, the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Troy T 
Murray of Prescott, Arizona, to 
Archy De Hamm, son of Mrs. Felix 
Monroe of this city . 

The wedding took place in the 
First Baptist Church at Prescott, 
with the pastor, Rev. Franklin Dod-
son officiating at, the 8 o'clock rites. 

Preceding the ceremony several 
nuptial selections were played by 
Mrs. Bert LaFuze ,organist and John 
Weston ,soloist. He sang "Because" 
and "I Love You Truly". Mrs. Stan-
ley L Power sang the prayer "0, 
Precious Love". 

For the wedding ,the church was 
decorated with large baskets of white 
gladioli and blue delphinums. The 
couple was married beneath an arch 
of white ace vine flanked by single 
cathedral stands bearing tall white 
tapers . 

Given in marriage by her father. 
the bride was lovely in a gown of 
white satin styled with a basque ef-
fect, featuring a sweetheart neckline 
finished with seed pearls, and the 
full skirt terminated in a long train 
with fitted sleeves ending in petal 
points. Her fingertip veil was of bri-
dal illusion and was held in place by 
a coronet cap caught with seed 
pearls. She carried an orchid cascad-
ed with stephanotis and her only 
jewelry was a double strand of 
pearls, a gift of the groom. 

Miss Vanora Murray attended her 
sister as maid of honor and Misses 
Jo Anne Black and Wanda Murray 
were bridesmaids. Mrs. Howard Por-
ter was matron of honor. 

Charles McDonald. former resident 
of this city, served as best man. 

During the reception, Mrs. Bennie 
McDonald, former resident of this 
city and mother of the best man, as-
sisted with the serving. 

The couple is residing at 311 S. 
Marina Street in Prescott. Hamm at-
tended the Farwell high school and 
later attended Bensons School of 
Commerce in Clovis. He is employ-
ed at the Zunick Motor Co., in Pres-
cott. 
	0 	 
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RED + 
PHARMACY 

Miss Joyce Ann Jones. daughter of 
Hubert Jones of Portales, became 
the bride of Waymon Wilkins. son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wilkins .of Friona 
in a simple ceremony held Stmday 
afternoon, September 25, in Friona. 

Rev. James Tidwell, Friona Metho-
dist pastor, performed the single ring 
nuptials in the Methodist parsonage. 
Witnesses were members of the im-
mediate families. 

The bride was charmingly attired 
in a street-length dress of aqua and 
carried a white Bible on which lay a 
cluster of white carnations, inter-
spersed with white satin streamers. 

Miss Barbara Hale of Clovis, was 
the bridesmaid and wore black crepe 
with a pink carnation corsage. G. A. 
Collier, of Friona, acted as best man. 

Following the ceremony, a recep-
tion was held in the home of the 
groom's aunt, Mrs. Raymond Adams 
of Friona, with a large number of 
friends and relatives attending. Miss 
Yvonna Lee Wilkins presided at the 
guest register, while Miss Alta Mae 
Wilkins and Miss Mary Nell Fulks 
were in charge of the serving table. 

The couple will be at home in Fri-
ona, where the groom is employed. 

Mrs. Albert Vohs Speaks 
At Bovina Study Club 

"The Chain'', by Paul Wellman, 
was the book reviewed by Mrs. Al-
bert Vohs of Clovis at a meeting of 
the Bovina Woman's Study Club on 
September 22 in the home of Mrs. 
George Trimble. Co-hostesses were 
Mesdames Aubrey Rhodes and Les-
ter Rhinehart. 

The entertaining rooms were dec-
orated with bouquets of chrysanthe-
mums and roses. Refreshments of 
pink and green wafers and fruit 
punch were served to 33 members 
and guests. 

Members attending were Mmes. 
A. B Wilkinson, Sam Sides, Otho 
Harnrncmds, Tom Caldwell, I. W. 
Quickel, Charles Ross. Webb Gober, 

'Billie Sudderth, Reagan Looney, Bill 
Kyle, Lewis Pesch, Clarence Jones, 
Bass Elliott, Bedford Caldwell, Will-
iam Thornton, Aubrey Rhodes, Les-
ter Rhinehart and George Trimble. 

Guests included Mmes. Harold 
Carpenter, Oscar Bruce, Bill Brad-
shaw, W. H. Willoughby, James 
Roahc, Lloyd Gober, Herbert Potts, 
Bob Johnston, John Kimbrow, all of 
Bovina; Mmes. Winfield Evans of 
Boston, Mass., George T. Cook, Har-
ry Vohs, E. W. Rogers, Elton Lob-
ban and Albert Vohs, all of Clovis, 

Mrs. Curtis Honored 
At Surprise Party 

Mrs. IL S. Curtis was honored at 
a surprise birthday patty in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. S. N. Lewis, 
the past Wednesday night, Septem-
ber 21. 

Following an evening of games 
and visiting, homemade ice cream 
and cake was served to Mr. and Mrs. 
W. E. Curtis and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. FL Curtis and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Duane Curtis and Mr. and 
Mrs. H. S. Curtis and Gerald, all of 
Farwell; Mn. Leroy Sisson and Mrs. 
Jane Gallagher of Clovis; Mrs. Rob-
ert Marton, Mrs. J. L. Nalley, Wlima 
Vaughan of Clovis, Mrs. Edna Ross, 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Lewis, Mrs. 
Alonzo Owens, Mrs. Lula Haynes 
and Pete Haynes, Raymond Haynes 
and Jack Crane, and the host and 
hostess, Mr. and Mrs. S. N. Lewis. 

Recreation Club Formed 
For Olahoma Loners 

Fifteen young married couples and 
their children met Saturday night, 
September 24th, at the Oklahoma 
Lane gymnasium and organized a re-
creation club. 

Elected as officers were Doyne 
Merriman, president; Mrs. Turner 
Paine, vice president; Mrs. Alton 
Berry, secretary; and Gilbert Wat-
kins, Tom Lindop and Alton Berry, 
recreation committee members. 

Ring games and dominoes were 
enjoyed and refreshments were sent-
ed, with the group adjourning at 11 
o'clock. Each member is to invite a 
guest for the next meeting, Saturday 
night. 
	-o 	 

Mrs. Roth Hostess To 
Companion S. S. Class 

First Birthday Noted 
For Tim Rhodes 

Mrs. Aubrey Rhodes of Bovina en-
tertained in her home Thursday, 
Sept. 15, with a party honoring her 
son Tim's first birthday. 

The large white cake was decorat-
ed with a pink candle and was plac-
ed on a central table on the lawn, 

Colored movies were taken of the 
children as they played, and refrsh-
merits of ice cream and cake were 
served to the children and their mo-
thers. Party favors were small hats 
which the children wore without too 
much objection. 

Those present were Mrs. Robert 
Calaway and sons, James Lee and 
Bobby Gene;- Mrs. Paul Jones and 
Randy, Mrs. Glenroy Davies and 
Wayne, Wendell, and Jackie; Mrs. 
William Thornton and Irene, Mrs. 
Bass Elliott and Vance, and the hos-
tess and son, Tim. 

For 

Surprise Social Held 
Wednesday Night 

Supt. Agrie Jones and Coach C. B. 
Stockton of the Texico school, who 
lats year were members of the Gra-
dy school faculty, were surprised the 
past Wednesday night when a num-
ber of their former co-workers from 
Grady arrived in Texico to stage c 
supper and social. 

In the group from Grady were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hall, Mr. and Mrs 
Mike Collins, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Hutto, Mrs. Lee and Miss Friar, 

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Pierce and 
daughter, Norma Lee, spent Sunday 
visiting friends in Hereford, with 
Norma Lee going on to Canyon to 
return to her College work_ 

Mrs. Peyton Honoree 
At Pink And Blue 
Shower Recently 

Mrs. N. W. Peyton was honored 
with a surprise pink and blue show-
er the past Tuesday evening, the so-

cial being *ie'd in the homemaking 
department of the Farwell school 
with Mrs. Jack Williams, Mrs. Tra-
vis Brown, Mrs. Otis Huggins and 
Mrs. Louis Purvis acting as co-host-
esses. 

After several games had been en-
joyed, a lovely refreshment plate 
featuring cakes iced in pink, with 
coffee, was served from a beautiful 
serving table, centered with huge i 
bouquets of cut flowers. 

Attendants included Mesdames R. 
D. Hensley, S. 0. Billington, W. E. 
Martin, Leonard Watkins, Donald 
Watkins, E. U. Scott, Pearl Single.. 
terry, Erma Jobes, H. M. Hopper. C. 
H. Whitener, Otis Branscum, B. A. 
Kelley, Homer Kelley, Milton Poteet, 
Herschel Morgan, Leona Bailey, Tru-
man Kent, F. E. Kepley. Stanley 
Stewart, A. R. Jester, C. F. Bunch, 
H. L. Ellsion, Joe Crume, Albert 
Smith; Misses Wilma L. Snider and 
Alta Martin. 

Regrets were received from Mmes. 
Tom Foster, Charles E. Daniel, Glen 
Singleterry, Byron Burford, Clar-
ence Smith, Perry Crawley, J. W. 
Herington, Murray Dial, Jack Mc-
Manigal, W. W. Hall, Ruby Meeks, 
Ruby Stone, Everett Christian, Mas- 
on Neeley, John Hightower, John 
Armour, Calvin Sanders, Dale Mc- 
Cuan, Melvin Snider, Lenton Pool, 
Graham Thornton, Elsie Cain, Earl 
Booth, Kenneth Jacques, Dorothy 
Jack, Harry Whitley, W. D. Hardage, 
Robert Morton, Charles Lunsford, 
Lee Roy Wilkerson, M. C. Roberts, 
Juanita Ray, Thelma Porter, Vernie 
'Townes, Claude Rose, Harry Dona-
hey, Clyde Magness, Jack Porter, 
Robert Porter; Misses Jeanean Luns-
ford, Valerie Dial and Bonnie oFster. 

Texico Teachers Will 
Be Honored, 29th 

Teachers of the Texico school, 
along with new parents of the com-
munity, will be honored on Thurs-
day evening, September ?QUI, when 
the first meeting of the Texico Par-
ent-Teacher Association will be held. 
The evening will be designed to fos-
ter closer acquaintance between the 
parents and educators. 

Members of the school faculty this 
year are Supt. and Mrs. Agrie Jones, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Stockton, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Armour, .John Adams, F. 
D. Stout, Mrs. LeRcy F aville, Mrs. 
Frank Seale, Mrs. B. A .Rogers, Mrs. 
Jimmie Allman and James G Hibbs. 

"Come and get acquainted with 
.your child's teacher, and through 
your cooperation we will have a bet-
ter school," PTA officials said today, 
in urging all parents of the commun-
ity to be at the school auditorium at 
8 o'clock, Texas time, Thursday. 

fine Companion Class of the Tex, 
ico-Farwell Baptist Church met in 
a regular session in the home of Mrs. 
T. E. Roth the past Wednesday eve-
ning. 

During a short business session, 
the following officers were elected: 
president, Mrs. Don Fought; vice 
president, Mrs. Peggy Greathouse; 
secretary-treasurer, Mrs. Marjorie 
Watkins; and social chairman, Mrs. 
Theda Watkins. 

Following the business meeting, 
refreshments of coke and candy 
were served by the hostess. 

Silver Anniversary, 
Housewarming Held 
Sunday At Field 

A double celebration was held on 
Sunday afternoon by Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Thomas, of the Field, N. M.. 
community, when the couple ob-
served their silver wedding anniver-
sary and also held a housewarming 
of their new home. Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas formerly lived here. 

The residence, completely modern, 
was recently finished, with Mr. and 
Mrs. Thomas doing the building. For 
Sunday the house was beautifully 
decorated with large bouquets of 
various fall flowers. The couple re-
ceived the guests at the door and a 
lovely serving table was presided 
over by their daughter, Miss Edna 
Ruth, and Mrs. Peggy Greathouse of 

Summer Piano Pupils 
In Recital Monday 

The summer class of piano pupils 
of Mrs. Florence Isilillwee Vinyard 
will be presented in a recital at the 
Methodist Church in this city on 
Monday evening, October 3, start-
ing at 8 o'clock. 

The class is composed of students 
from Texico-Farwell and Friona, 
and an interesting program is being 
arranged. The public is invited to 
attend. 

In Johnson Home 
Mrs. Jones L. Winter, of Clovis, 

visited in the home of Mrs. Effie 
oJhnson in Farwell, the past Mon-
day afternoon. The ladies have been 
friends for several years but this 
was their first meeting in 26 years. 
They attended the joint meeting of 
the Baptist Sunday School classes on 
Monday night, at which Mrs. Winter 
was the guest speaker. 

To Broadview Sunday 
Among the attendants at a dinner 

held at the newly-completed home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Grady Box, near Broad-
view, N. M., Sunday, were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Bob Smart, Mrs. Bettie 
Smart, Mr. and Mrs. Ben 0. Smart 
and family and Miss Hazel Dishman 
of Farwell, and Misses Mary Lou 
and Patricia Hatcher of Hereford. 

Saturday Specials 

mer Residents Of 
Texico. 	 ' Byers, Texas, Enjoy 

Attending from Texico-Farwell 
were Mr. and Mrs. Paul Wurster and Reunion, Sunday 
son, Tommie: Mrs. Albert Thomas, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kepley and Mr. 
Mr. and Mrs. Olan Schleuter, Mrs. and Mrs. Ode Gulley and son. Bud-
Peggy Greathouse, Mr. and Mrs. Guy dy of Farwell, visted in the home of 
Cox. Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Graham Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Davis of Mule-
and daughter, Sammy, Mr. and Mrs. shoe, Tex., Sunday, and enjoyed a 
LeRoy Faville and Mikala Anne. 	picnic style luncheon. The occasion 

was a reunion of several families 

Local Girl Named As 	who formerly lived at Byers, Texas. 
Those who enjoyed the day with 

them were Mr. and Mrs. Otis Beason 
and niece, Susan Nail, Amherst, Tex., Peggy Rogers Named 
Mrs. W. H. Davis, Lubbock; Mrs. 
Alonzo Clary and_daughter, Luanna, 
and Miss Lorene Clary, Hot Springs, 
N. M.; David Wyer and Dorothy 
Waggoner, Miss Verona Warner, 

sit y have recently been filled. Miss 
Muleshoe; Mr. and Mrs. Harlow Da Peggy Rogers, daughter of Mr. and vis. Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Davis, John 

Mrs. B. A. Rogers of Texico, has 
been elected vice president. 

Joan Lackey, Morton, was selected 
as secretary and Neta Pierce Gant, 
Clovis, will be the new historian. 

To Sorority Office 
PORTALES—Three vacancies in 

offices of Kappa Delta Alpha soro-
rity at Eastern New Mexico Univer- 

Davis, and Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Davis, 
all of Muleshoe. 

Sunday School Classes 
'Hold Joint Meeting 

The Golden Circle and Ruth Sun-
day School classes of the Texico-
Farwell Baptist church held their re-
gular quarterly joint meeting Mon-
day night, September 26, in the un-
dercroft of the church. 

Mrs. Jones L. Winter, of Clovis, as-
sociational WMU president, gave a 
very interesting study on "Jesus and 
Missions", to approximately twenty 
attendants. 

A short business session was held 
after which delicious refreshments 
of hot coffee, canapes and cookies 
were served by the hostesses, Mes-
dams Frank Seale, R. L. Day, Walter 
Hardage and Odis Branscum. 

J. 0. Glover Honoree 
At Birthday Social 

On the night of Sept. 17. J. 0. Glo-
ver was surprised when several rela-
tive sand friends gathered at the Glo-
ver home to, help him celebrate his 
67th birthday. 

After a social hour, a lovely cake 
presented by Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Armstrong was cut and served with 
coffee to those present. 

In Roop Home 
Visitors in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. E. M. Roop in Texico, the paSt 
weekend, were Mr. and. Mrs. E. M. 
Roop and family of Port, Kansas, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Roop of Balling-
er, Texas; and Jim Bob Hoop, son of 
the local people, who is a student at 

'Texas Tech in Lubbock. 

Visit In El Paso 
Charlie Bieler of this city, accom-

panied his daughter and son-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs.'Marty Ezell, of Portal-
es, to Albuquerque, the past week-
end, where they were called by the 
death of Mr. Fent, rerlative of the 
local man. Aftr stopping in Albu-
querque, the party went on to El 
Paso to visit Mrs, Jimmie Alsup, the 
former Anita Mary Bieler. 
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COFFEE 
Any brand, per pound 	  

SUGAR 
Pure cane, 10 lbs 	  

CANNED MILK 
Tall cans, 2 for 	  

PINK SALMON 
Tall can only 	  

TOILET TISSUE 
Northern,'3 rolls for 	  

ORANGE-ADE 
46-oz. can 	  

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 
46-oz. can 	  

CRISCO 
3-lb. tin 	 

TREND 
For washing, 2 boxes 	  

PEACHES 
Texo, gallon can only 	  

SW EAT H EA RT SOAP 
• Bath size cakes, 4 for 	  

KLEENEX 
300 count, 23c, 200 count, per box 	  

DREFT or VEL 
Per box only 	  

SUGAR 
Powdered or Brown, 2 lbs 	  

HONEY 
Pure, 5-lb. pail 	  

SALAD DRESSING 
Miracle Whip, quart 	  

CHOCOLATE SYRUP 
Hershey's, 1-lb. can 	  

PINTO BEANS 
Colorado, new crop, 3 lbs 	  

PRESERVES 
Pure, peach or apricot, 2-1b. jar 	  

JELLO 
Any flavor, 3 packages for 	  

ENMU Choir Officer 
PORTALES—With the election of 

!officers, plans for the year by the 
Eastern New Mexico University 
choir are well underway, according_ 
to Joe I. Myers, director. 

Margaret Cole, Portales junior, has 
been chosen president, with Jess 
Lara, Scottsbluff, Neb., freshman, as 
vice president; Peggy Rogers, Tex-
ico sophomore, treasurer; and May-
delle Smith, Portales senior, secre-
tary. 

Miss Rogers is also a member of 
the choir social committee. 

Plans for activities include a con-
cert in late October, presentation of 
Handel's "Messiah" in December 
and an operetta in the spring. 

"IA 

Hall's Grocery & Market 
^ 	- 	• s-  • e • 

SPECIALS 
THURSDAY FRIDAY — SATURDAY 

T-SHIRTS, Girls', all colors and sizes $1.79 
DRESS PANTS, Boys', part wool 

	
$2.93 

Brown or Blue 
HOSE, Nylon, 60-gauge, new fall colors $1.98 
BATES BEDSPREADS, Plaids 	 $7.00 
DOLL SETS, Silk Jersey, gowns & pants 	98c 
SHIRTS, Men's gabardine, sport 	$4.98 
CAPS, Corduroy, brown or tan 	$1.29 
BLOUSES, Ladies', white crepe 	$2.93 

Long Sleeve Styles 
CAKE PLATES, glass & plastic, colors $1.89 
SUGAR & CREAMER, cut glass, set 	 35c 
RICERS, Aluminum 	 89c 
TRAYS, Draining, Rubbermaid deluxe_42.98 
DISH RACKS, Rubberized 	 $1.89 
DUPONT CEMENT, mends everything 29c 
DRAPERY RINGS, Lifetime, pr. 	 29c 
DRAPERY TIEBACKS, Lifetime, pr.___ 	29c 
BLUE DENIMS, Dickies boxer type 	 $1.29 

Boys or Girls, Sizes 0 to 8 

Stone's Variety Store 
Texico, N. M. 

V' 	- 



We Are Ready To 

Gin Your Cotton 

Brand New Gin 
WE HAVE INSTALLED 

4 New Continental 80-Saw Gin Stands—Equipped With The Latest 

t MITCHELL CLEANING & DRYING EQUIPMENT 
WE WILL PAY HIGHEST MARKET PRICE FOR YOUR 

Cotton and Cottonseed 
Or We Will Mace Your Cotton In The Government Loan 

Lariat Gin 
GUY NICKLES, Owner 

LARIAT 	 TEXAS 

With A 

Motor Throbs 
Motor throbs can be caused by any number of 

minor or major mechanical troubles, ranging from 
a slight adjustment to a complete overhaul. 

In either case, our trained mechanics can put 
your engine to purring like a young kitten .... 

and at a most reasonable charge. 

PACE BROS. 
Texico, N. M. 
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Weed letterheads? Dial 2131. 

DR. B. R. PUTMAN 
OPTOMETRIST 

Muleshoe, 	— 	Texas 	• 

tablecloth and napkins, 1st on table-
cloth, 1st and 3rd on pillow cases, 
1st on vanity set. 

Mrs. C. A. Paul, Friona, 2nd on 
buffet set, 2nd on rug. 

Mrs. Foister Rector, Friona, 1st on 
pillow cases, 2nd on piano scarf, 2nd 
on vanity set, 1st on quilt, 1st on 
afghan. 

Mrs. Julia Fairchild, Friona, 1st on 
tea towels, 1st on guest towels. 

Mrs, George Reed, Friona, 1st, 2nd 
and 3rd cei bathroom rugs. 

Mrs. Jean Reid, 2nd on rugs. 
Mrs. Joe Menefee, Friona, 3rd on 

doilies. 
,Mrs. H. B. Horn, Friona, 3rd on 

vanity set,- 3rd on dish towels. 
Mrs. E. B. Brannon, Friona, let on 

doilies, 2nd on afghan, 3rd on table-
cloth. 

.7,dges were Mrs. Johnnie Black 
burn and Mrs. Boren. 

Expert Watch And 

Clock Repairing 

All Work Guaranteed 

3 To 5 Day Service 

—LEE NICHOLS 

At Hardage Hudson Co. 

2nd; Friona Consumers, 3rd. 
Pets—Dale Williams, 1st; Palma-

Leer, 2nd; Barbara Lloyd, 3rd. 
Bikes—Mary Tom Spring, 1st 

Phila Mae and Lila Gaye Buske, 
2nd; 

School floats—Friona freshmen 
1st; Friona juniors, 2nd; Friona 
sophomores, 312. 

HOME ARTS, DEPARTMENT 
Miss Louise Kleehans, Lakeview .  

3rd on potholders. • 
Mrs. G. L. Mingus. Friona, 2nd and 

3rd on quilts, 1st and 3rd on doilies. 
Mrs. F. M. Agee, Friona, 2nd on 

quilt, 2nd on dish towels. 
Mrs. Ruby Dixon, Farwell, 2nd on 

doily, 2nd on hot. pad, 3rd on -pin 
cushion. 

Mrs. W. H. Graham, Farwell, 3rd 
on quilt. 	 • 

Lawrie Brewer, Farwell, 1st 
on baby: quilt. 

Bertie Stowers, Fricna, 3rd 
on flowers. 

Mrs. Joe Brurnmett, Friona, 2nd 
and 3rd on towels. 

Mrs. H. G. Beene, Fliona, 2nd on 
pillow cases, 2nd on table.ctoth. 

Mrs. J. L. Taylor, F r.a, 2nd on 
doilies, 1st on bedspread. 

Mrs. M. M. Sherley, Friona, 2nd on 
doily, 1st on. scarf, 3rd on bedspread, 
1st on tablecloth. 

!Tenn Reeve, Friona, 1st on 
stuffed doll, 2nd on bedspread. 

Mrs. J. A. Wimberley, Friona, 1st 
on chair set, 1st on doilies, 1st on 
scarf. 

Mrs. M. S. Weir, Friona, 2nd on 

Maxine Thompson. 
Grand champion—J. S. and Maxine 

Thompson. 
Get of sire—Eugene Boggess, 1st; 

Virgil Teague, 2nd. 
MILK PRODUCTION 

Jerseys, Class 1—C. W. Grissom. 
)kla. Lane, 1st, 2.07 butterfat, 38.4 
'ilk, 5.4%; Ray Strickland, Friona, 
nd, 1.34 butterfat, 23.6 milk,. 5.5%; 
_ewis Gore, Friona, 3rd, 1.28 butter-
it, 21.1 milk, 6.1%. 
Jerseys, Class 2—Joe Faliwell, Fri-

1a, 1st, 1.39 butterfat, 31.8 milk, 
1%; Tommy Jones, Fricna, 2nd. 
16 butterfat, 22.4 milk, 5.4%; Ray 
trickland,. Friona, 3rd, 1.1 butter-
it, 18.4 milk, 5.5%. 
Jerseys, Class 3—Ross. Miller, Fri-

-la, 1st, 1.06 butterfat, 20.0 milk, 
.3%. 	 • 
Holsteins, Class 1—Ray Strickland.  

'riona,• 1st, - 1.80 butterfat, 40.1 milk, 
.5%. 

• - %CROPS 
Corn, 10 cars—Claude Primrose, 

'arwell, 2nd: 	• 	 • 
Grain sorghum, gallon milo—Har-

Id Carpenter, Okla. Lane, 2nd: 
Grain sorghum, 10 heads milo—

ohn H. West, Farwell, 1st; Calvin 
',artier, Bovine, 2nd; Leon Langford, 
'arwell, 3rd. 

Hegari—Joe Horn, Friona, 1st; C. 
C. Christian, Okla. Lane, 2nd; Lon-

ie Dee and Virgil Merriot, Lazbud-
ly, 3rd. 

PARADE ENTRIES 
Outside Floats—Friona Communi-

y Hospital, 1st; Friona Cub Scouts, FIRST PLACE in community exhibits at the Parmer Coun-
ty Fair, in Friona, went to the booth pictured above, entered 

cr• from Farwell. Jimmy McGuire was chairman of the committee 
with John Aldridge and Joe Camp as members preparing the 
exhibit. 	. 

Prize Winners 
(Continued from preceding page) 

with Strickalnd placing two blue rib-
bon animals; Loyd Rector, 2nd and 
3rd; Joe Fallwell, 4th; Max Wells 
and Friona FFA, 5th. 

Cow dropped before July 1, 1945—
Ray Strickland and Lewis Gore, 1st; 
Sterling Donaldson, 2nd; Wendol 
Christian, 3rd; G. A. Collier and Fri-
ona FFA, 4th; Wendol Christian, 5th. 

Senior champion cow—L M. Gris-
som, Ross Miller, Sterling Donald-
son, Ray Strickland. 

Grand champion cow, Ray Strick-
land. 

Get of sire—Ray Stg,:kland, 1st; 
Friona FFA, 2nd; Ross Miller, 3rd; 
Wendol Christian, 4th; G. A. Collier, 
5th. 

Yearling herd (bull and two heif-
ers)—Friona FFA, 1st; G. A. Collier, 
2nd; Max Wells, 3rd; Wendol Chris-
tian, 4th. 

Produce of dam two)—Friona FFA 
Tst; G. A. Collier, 2nd; Ray Strick-
land; 3rd; Ross Miller, 4th; Max 
We , 5th. 

REFORD DEPARTMENT 
Bulls 2 years and over—F. T 

Schlenker, Friona, 1st and 2nd. 
Bulls 1.•year and under 2--Elmer 

Langford, Farwell, 1st. 
Grand champion—Elmer Lang-

ford. 
Cows 1 year and under 2--Elmer 

Langford, 1st; Leon and Delvin 
Langford, Farwell, 2nd; Ralph and 
Frank Reed, Friona, 3rd; F. T. 
Schlenker, 4th; Ralph and Frank 
Reed, 5th. 

Cows two years and over—Jack 
London, Friona, lst. 

Grand champion female—Elme 
Langford, Farwell. 

GUERNSEY DEPARTMENT 
Bull drcipped between Jan. 1, 1949 

and June 30, 1949—Gary Crow, 1st 
and 2nd. 

Bull dropped between July 1, 1947 
and June 30, 1948—Gary Crow, 1st. 

Grand champion bull—Gary Crow 
Heifer dropped between July 1. 

1948 and Dec. 31. 1948—Gary Crow, 
1St. 

Grand champion cow—Gary Crow. 
HOLSTEIN DEPARTMENT 

Bull dropped between July 1, 1947 
and June 30, 1948—Gary Crow. 

CARY dropped before July 1, 1946—
ilay Strickland. 

BROWN SWISS DEPARTMENT 
BuP. dropped between Jan. 1, 194 

and June 30, 1919—D. C. Burnett. 
Bull dronne: between July 1, 194 

	

and Dec.• 	31, 1948—D. C. Burnett. 

	

tr. 	,:toope-; tetween July 1, 194 
and June 30, 1947—D. C. Burnett. 

sunior champion bull—D. C. Bur 
nett. 

Heifer dropped between Jan. I 
1949 and Ju-te 30, 1949—D. C. Bur 
nett, 1st and 2nd. 

Heifer dropped. between July I 
1948 and Dec. 31, 1948—D. C. Bur 
nett, 1st and 2nd. 

Grand champion female—D. C 
Burnett. 

MILKING SHORTHORN DEPT. 
Bull dropped between Jan. I, 194 

and June 30, 1949—W. H. Flippin 
Jr., 1st; Virgil Teague, 2nd. 

Bull dropped between July 1, 1941 
and Dec. 31, 1948—Owen Patton. 

Bull dropped between July 1, 194' 
and June 30, 1948—J. S. and Maxim 
Thompson, 1st; Eugene Boggess 
2nd; W. H. Flippin, Jr., 3rd; Virgi.  
Teague, 4th; Levi Johnson, nth. 

Bull dropped before July 1, 1945—
Fred Kepley 

Junior champion bull—Owen Pat-
ton. 

Senior champion bull--Fred Kep 
ley. 

Grand champion—Fred Kepley. 
Heifer dropped between July 1 

1948 and Dec. 31,1948—Eugene Bog 
gess, 1st; J. S. and Maxine Thomp 
son., 2nd; Levi JOhnson, 3rd• W. B 
Flippin, Jr., 4th; Mrs. R. E. Wolfe 
5th. 

Cow dropped between July 1, 194£ 
and June 30-1948-4. S .and Maxine 
Thompson, iFt Levi Johnson, 
Milburn Bennett, Srd; Virgil Teague 
4th and 5th. 

Cow dropped between July 1, 194( 
and June 30. 1947—W. H. Flippin 
Jr., list and 2nd; Dale Hart, 3rd. 

Cow dropped between July 1, 1942 
and June 30, 1946—J. S. and Maxim: 
Thompson, 1st; Levi Johnson, 2nd; 

Cow dropped before July 1, 1945--
Eugene Boggess, 1st; Levi Johnson.  
2nd; Dale Hart, 3rd; W. H. Flippin 
Jr., 4th. 

Junior champiori female—Eugene 
Boggess. 

Senior champion female—J. S. an( 

STEED 
Funeral Home 

"Serving Clovis 

Territory 

Since Clovis Began" 

Phone 5541 

Clovis, N. M. 



F 	RD TRUCKS 
LAST LONGER! 

They're Bonus Built with extra 
strength! That's why Ford Trucks 
have fewer profit-eating break-
downs. Whether it's the 145-h.p. 
V-8, the 100-6.p. V-8, or the 
95-h.p. Six—you get real gas and 
oil savings. 

Over 150 Models to choose 
froin! Every Ford Truck has the 
Million Dollar Cab with Ford 
Level Action suspension, new 
cpa ch-type seats, 3-way air con-
trol. Drop in today and see 'ern 
for yourself. 

SEE YOUR FORD DEALER 

SIKES MOTOR COMPANY 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

Tim 145-h.p. Ford F-8. Gross 
Combination Weight rating with 
soml-trailor up to 39,000 Am 
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List or Prize Winners Given at Parmer County Fair and Dairy Show 
Following is a complete list of 

prize winners at the Parmer County 
Dairy Show and Fan, held last week-
end :n Friona, as released by Fair 
officials to The Tribune: 

SWINE 

Grand Champion Sow, Donnie 
Carpenter, Farwell. 

Gwad Champion Boar, Darrell 
Norton, Farwell. 

TWO FARWELL BOYS carried off the swine division at 
the Parmer County Fair, held over the weekend in Friona. Dar. 
rell 'Norton exhibited the boar, in top picture, while the iower 
photo shows th champion sow, owned by Donnie Carpenter. 

JERSEY CHAMPIONS at the Parmer County fair were 
exhibited by the Friona FFA chapter and Ray Strickland, also 
of Friona. The top picture shows "Volunteer", being handled 
at a safe distance by ag man J. T. Gee. In the lower cut Mrs. 
Strickland poses with her son's grand champion cow. 

Rex Isham, Bovina FFA, 4th; Glen 
Isham, Bovina 4H, 5th. 

Aged boar—Kenneth Lowrie, Bo-
vina 411, 1st. 

Berkshire 
Boar under 1 year—Bobby Jack 

Barlow, Farwell, 1st. 
Open gilt—Bobby Jack Barlow, 

Farwell, 1st. 
Bred gilt—Bobby Jack Barlow. 

Farwell, 1st and 2nd. 
Sow and litter (all breeds)—Rex 

Blackburn, Friona FFA, 1st; Charlie 
Williams, Bovina 4H, 2nd; Keith 
Brock, Friona FFA, 3rd; J. Cobb, 
Friona FFA, 4th; Giles Walling, Bo-
vine FFA, 5th. 

Fat barrows (all breeds)—Max 
Crim, Lazbuddy 4H, 1st; Jackie Do-
sher, Farwell FFA, 2nd; Max Crim, 
3rd; Jr. Mallouf, Lazbuddy 4H, 4th; 
Charles Phillips, Farwell FFA, 5th. 

Pen-  of three—Kenneth Lowrie 
Bovina 4H, 1st; Max Crim, 2nd; 
Lewis Gore, Friona ETA, 3rd; J. Do-
sher, Farwell FFA, 4th; Walter 
Haws, Friona FFA, 5th. 

Fat litter—Lewis Gore, Friona 
FFA, 1st; Tommie Jones, Friona 
FFA, 2nd; Walter Haws, Friona 
FFA, 3rd. 

JERSEY DEPARTMENT 
Bull dropped after Jan. 1, 1949—

Joe Fallwell, Friona, lst. 
Bull dropped between July i, 1948 

and Dec. 31, 1948—Friona FFA, 1st; 
Max Wells, Friona, 2nd, Lewis Gore, 
Friona, 3rd; Sterling Donaldson, Far-
well, 4th. 

Bull dropped between Jan. 1. 194" 
'and June 30, 1948--G. A. Collier, 
Friona, 1st. 

Bull dropped between July 1, 1947 
and Dec.. 31, 1947—Friona FFA, 1st. 

Bull dropped between July 1, 1946 
and June 30, 1947—Friona ETA, 1st; 
C. W. Grissom, Okla. lane, 2nd. 

Bull dropped before July 1, 1945--
Friona FFA, 1st. 

Junior champion—Friona FFA. 
Senior and grand champion—Frio- 

• 
Breed Champion 

Sows: 

Chester White—Donnie Carpenter, 
Farwell 411. 

Duroc—D. 0. Robason, Friona, 
FFA. 

Hampshire--Jessie Coburn, Far-
well, ETA. 

Spotted Poland China—James Tid-
enberg, Bovina 411. 

Poland China—Billy Johnson, Bo-
vina 4H. 

Berkshire—Bobby Jack Barlow, 
Farwell. 
Boars: 

Chester White—Darrell. Norton, 
Farwell 4H. 

Duroc—Charles Phillips, Farwell 
FFA. 

Hampshire_Keith Brock, Friona 
FFA. 

Spotted Poland China—James Tid-
enberg. 

Poland China—Kenneth Lowrie, 
Bovina FFA. 

Berkshire—Bobby Jack Barlow. 
Chester Whites: 

Boars under 1 year—Charles Ver- 
ner, Bovina 4H, 1st; Bobby Calaway, 
Bovina 4H, 2nd. 

Aged Boar—Darrell Norton, Far-
well 4H. 

Open Gilts:—Donnie Carpenter, 
Farwell 4H, 1st; Charles Phillips, 
Farwell 4H 2na; ,carne, iluerr4 .e, 
Boviina 411, 3td; Troy Christian, Far-
well 4H, 4th; Jerry Gleason, Lazbtid-
dy 411, 5th. 

Sows under 2 years—Max Crim, 
Lazbuddy 411, lst;.Walter Haws, Fri- 

! Sow under 2 years—JeSse Coburn, 
1st. 
I Bred Gilt—Ben Jordon,, Friona 
FFA, 1st. 

aria 411, 2nd and 3rd. 	 na ETA. 
Bred Gilis-r-Darrell Norton, --1st. 	Heifer dropped after Jan. 1, 1949— 

Durocs 	 Keith Brock, Friona, 1st; Max Wells, 
Sows under 2—D. 0. Robason, Fri- Friona, 2nd; Ray Strickland, Friona, 

ona FFA, 1st. 	 3rd; Max Wells, 4th; Wendol Chris- 
! Open gifts—Billy Medley, Farwell tiara, Okla. Lane, 5th. 
FFA,"lst. Heifer dropped between July 1, 

I Boar under 1 year—Charles Phil- 1948 and Dec. 31, 1948—Friona FFA, 
ips, Farwell ETA, 1st. 	 1st and 2nd; Ray Strickland, 3rd: 

	

Hemp:tires 	 Troy Christian, Okla. Lane, 4th; G. 
Boar under 1 year—Jesse Coburn, A. Collier, Friona, 5th. 

Farwell FFA, 1st. 	 Heifer droPped between Jan. 1. 
Aged boar—Keith Brock, Friona 1948 and June 30, 1948—Joe Fall- 

I FFA, 1st. 	 well, Friona, 1st; Lewis Gore, .gn d ; 
Ross Miller,Friona, 3rd; Fricna FFA 
4th; Tommy Jones, Friona, 5th. 

Junior champion heifer—Keith 
Brock, Friona FFA, Joe Fallwell. 

Spotted Poland China 	Cow dropped between July 1, 1947 
Open gilt—Vernon Petty, Friona and Dec. 31, 1947—L. M. Grissom 

FFA, 1st; Jerry Owens, Farwell 411, and C. W. Grissom of Farwell, andl 
2nd; James Tidenberg, Bovina 4H, Duane Martin, all 1st; Ross Miller I 
3rd, 4th and 5th. 	 and Max Wells, 2nd; Donald Petty I 

Bred gilts—James Tidenberg, Bo- 3rd; Fay Fitzgerald and Max Wells. 
vina 4H, 1st and 2nd; F. T. Schlenk- 4th; Bobby Mercer and Ross Miller, 
er, Friona, 3rd. 	 5th. 

Aged boar—James Tidenberg, 1st. Cow dropped between July 1, 1946 
Boar under 1 year—Jam-es Tiden- and June 30, 1947—Ross Miller, 1st; 

berg, 1st and 2nd. 	 Troy Christian, 2nd; Jim Gore, Lew- 
Sow under two—James Tidenberg, is Gore and Tommy Gones, 3rd; Ray 

1st. 	 Strickland, two 4th places; Ross Mil- 
Aged sow—James Tidenberg, 1st. ler and Loyd Rector, 5th. 

	

Poland China 	 Cow dropped between July 1, 1945 
Bred Gilts—Billy Johnson, Farwell and June 30, 1946—Sterling Donald-

4H, 1st; Julias Bradshaw, Bovina 4H, son and Ray Strickland, both 1st 
2nd; Virgil Phipps, Friona FFA, 3rd; 	(Continued on Following Page) 

FAMILY ACT is porci•Rd in the Hereford division of Int. 
Parmer County fair, with Elmer Langford and his son, of this 
tity, exhibiting the grand champion bull (above) and the 
female winner (below). FRED KEPLEY of the Oklahoma Lane community proud- 

• ly holds the tether on his grand champion Milking Shorthorn 
bull, shown at the county fair. The lower picture is a repeat 
performance for the Milking Shorthorn female owned by John 

and Maxine Thompson, with the cow holding top breed hon-
ors for the second consecutive year. 

r 
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SERVICE to 

New Orleans 
Houston 

Fort Worth 
Dallas 

Through Pullman to Houston-New Orleans 
Ar. Houston 8.25 am Lv. Farwell 4:15 p. m. 
Ar. New Orleans 	 7.35 pm 

Through Chair Car to Houston 

Through Pullman and Chair Car to Ft. Worth 

and Dallas via Santa Fe all the Way! 
Ar. Fort Worth 	 6.25 am Lv. Farwell 9:15 p. m 

- 	Ar. Dallas 	 8  00 am 

hi 
Santa Fe 

I 

FAST CALIFORNIA TRAIN 
LEAVES FARWELL 11:15 a. m. 

For Details Call: 
Ticket Office 

Santa Fe Station—Farwell 
Phone: 2051 

At  PENNEY'S 

Better than ever ,.. this new version of a top best seller! It boasts 

a nice, 1-o-n-g 40" covered zipper fastening. It's done in that washday favor-

ite, 80 square percale, in fresh new prints, with a great big 120" sweep 
aim And ... it comes in sizes from 12 to 40! 

!Beg. V. S. Pat. Off. 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 

A BRENTWOOD* FAVORITE 

WITH A 40 INCH 

ZIPPER FRONT! 

ou ENTERED 

\ \. 

ht e e Aafrettabi It's your big chance to win 
one of these 700 prizes! 

cars and trucks should be safety 
chocked periodically because 	" 

Drive to any Ford Dealer 

displaying poster shown below, 

2. Get Free Car-Salety Check, 

Safety Insignia and Entry Blank 

4-Door Custom V-8 Ford Sedans, equipped 
with Radio. "Magic Air" Heater. Over-
drive, and White Sidewall Tires. 

4. Mail entry before midnight. 

October 31, to Ford Car-Safety 
Contest Headquarters, Box #722, 
Chicago 77, Illinois. 

* 
truck may be considered. All 
entries become the property 
of Ford. Contest subject to 
Federal. State, local regula-
tions and rules on entry blank. 
(d) Winners' names will be 
posted at all Ford Dealers' not 
later than December 1, 1949. 
(e) Contest open to all rtml-
dents of U. S. except employ-
ees of Ford Motor Company, 
Ford Dealers, their advertia- 
tng 	or their families. 

Bowe Buil to lad Loner 

(Optional) 
General Duty Model F-5. V-8 angina, 

stake body, 158-inch wheelbase FORD Texas, equipped with 
Radio and -Magic Air Heater. Optional as prizes to the top 
5 of the 25 car winners who specify preference tot a truck 
on Contest Entry Blank 

3. In 50 words or less on entry 

blank finish this statement: "All 

* * 
(a) Uee any Ford Deale.r's 
official entry blank only. Print 
name and address! dearly. 

(6) Contest limited to conti-
nental U. S. and Alaska. 

(c) Prizes aa elated on entry 
blank awarded for sincerity, 
originality and aptness. 
Judges' decisions final. Dupli-
cate prices in case of two. 
Entries must be submitted in 
the name of registered owner 
or designated representative. 
Only one entry per car or 

25 4V000 as 
Stew Satin 

VO 4190 ea 
S4444VS BONX 

GE7 THIS 
ATTRACTIVE 
REFLECTOR 
INSPGMA fREEI 

SIKES MOTOR COMPANY 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

SEND :Lt] YOUR ENTRY ior CONTEST CLOSES OCT. 31 

2006 0 la..tases Saws 
3.W 	U. IStosivss Saws 

Drive In today! 
Free Safety Check, Get your Entry Blank 

MO WWI 

Aro farm ems Nos ser•-•.•••• sok 

••••• MIN 

Get your 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

TRIBUNE ADS BRING HOME THE BACON VETS SHOULD WATCH FOR 
ELIGIBILITY CHANGES 

J 

c) THE MAR VELS will appeal 
ses at government expense 
have been prohibited by law, 

Certain changes in certificates o' 
eligibility for World War TI veteran' 
planning to train under the GI BO' 
have been made, and it will be nee 
essary that all veterans comply wit' 
these new instructions in order tr.  
avoid delay in entering school. fob 
ert W. Sistsen, Veterans Adminislra 
Lion regional manager at Lubbock 
annorn-erl today. 

Certificates of eigibilitv issued tr 
World War H veterans planning tr 
train under the GI Hill from now or'  
will include (1) the name of the 
course a veteran wants to take, and 
(2) the name of the mar:roved school 
at which he wants to.pursue the 
course. 

The new tune ceeificate will he 
good only for the listed course in the 
specific school named. 

The additional information on cer-
tificates of eligibility. Siren explain-
ed, will aid VA in its effort to help 
veterans get training that will be of 
direct vise to their readjustment to 
civilian life, or avocational purposes. 

Also, Sisson added, a veteran ask-
ed to select a school and course be-
fore he even obtains a certificate 
would be more ant to give serious 
thought to his educational objectives 
and to the institution in which he 
wished to pursue those objectives. 

In the past, veterans were not ask-
ed to list the course or school on an-
plications for GI Bill training. Certi-
ficates of eligibility, therefore, could 
be used for nearly any course in any 
institution that had appropriate GI 

whichl nightly at the 32nd annual Pan-
handle South Plains Fair, Sept. 28- 

' Oct. 1 at Lubbo:k, in the Gertrude 
veterans who had certificates of and Randolph Avery Musical Revue 

eligibility issued before September 1, ; The group of teeter-board tumblers 

Bill approval. 
Hu... Public Law 266. passed Aug-

ust 24 of this year, prohibits veterans 
from taking GI Bill courses for avo-
cational or recreational purposes, or 
courses in institutions not in exit-
tence for at least one year. The ntv.-
type certificate—with course and 
school listed—have become necessary 
in order to screen applications and to 
prevent veterans from taking cour- 

are pictured above as they send one 
of their members sailing through the 
air to land in the chair which is sup-
ported on top of a 14-foot pole. 

0 	 
mental certificate will not be good 
if the course taken is flight training 
or one of the types requiring justifi-
cation. 

Effective March 1, 1950, all out-
standing supplemental certificates of 
elibility—regardless of the purpose 
for which they were issued—will be 
void. 

After his application is processed 
and found to be in order, he may 
use it only for the course and school 
listed. 

'948, have been urged repeatedly by 
VA to exchange them for certificates 
bearing-  identifying "C" or claims 
numbers. Those few veterans who 
still have the old certificates should 
surrender them for the new type—
listing course and school—before 
commerr:tag a course of training. 

Veterans who never have had a 
course of training and now have un-
used certificates of eligibility—issued 
after September 1, 1948—may use 
them as they are until March 1, 1950. 
They need not be exchanged forenew 
certificates, but after March 1, 1950, 
they will not be valid. 

Those certificates, Sisson added, 
may not be used for elementary 
flight, private pilot and commercial 
pilot courses, or for any course for 
which veterans are required to sub-
mit justification that the training 
will serve a bona fide use in present 
or future business or employment. 

The date the certificate was issued 
may be found in a box "Item Six" in 
the upper right hand corner of the 
certificate, directly to the right of 
space for the veteran's name. 

Supplemental certificates of eligi-
bility—issued before September 12, 

1949, to veterans desiring to change 
courses or schools—may be used for 
enrollment in current fall terms on-
ly until November 1, Sisson said. 

After November 1, and until March 
1, 1950, the supplemental certificates 
no longer will be valid—with a sin-
gle exception. 

That exception is a supplemental 
certificate obtained by a veteran for 
the purpose of changing his school, 
but not his course, without loss of 
credit. 

But even in that case, the supple- 

Cull Your Loafers 
This is the season of the year when you 

should cull the unproductive hens from 

your flock and turn them into cash 

We are in the market for your non-lay-

laying hens, especially if they are nice • 

and fat. 

SEE US BEFORE YOU 

SELL THEM! 

Watkins Ice, Feed 
& Produce Company 

FARWELL, TEXAS 
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to-market program service oil fields 
and forest-lumber operations. 

When the present program of FM 
construction is completed, the vast 
majority of farm dwellings will be 
within one mile of a paved road. 

Sudderth Serves With 
8th Army In Japan 

purnicity; and. June Wimberley, mu-
sic. 

In the Demonstration school new 
members are Toney Brown, science; 
Miss Alice Payne, English; "and Mrs. 
A. B. Holt, second grade. 

o 	 

Robert D. May, son of Mr. an 
Mrs. Lucas D. May of Pomona, 
California, has recently been promo-
ted to the grade of corporal, it has 
been announced. May is currently 
assigned to the 5th Air Force at 
Johnson Air Base near Tokyo, Jap- 

Texans May Drive On 

upon the recommendations of district 
engineers after conferences with 
county commissioners. Location is 
determined by the highway commis-
sion on the basis of need as these 
figures show: 

72 per cent of FM roads carry 
school buses; 74 percent carry mail 
routes; 24 per cent carry milk routes; 
and 87 per cent carry one or more of 
these sevices. 

Other roads built under the farm- 

88,443 Miles Of Roads 
Boilers, fryers, milk, lettuce, can-

ned apricots, peaches and mixed 
fruits join the list of plentiful foods 
for June. 

cated at the base of the picturesque Former Texico Lad 
volcano of Japan, Mount fujiyania. 

Cpl. Sudderth entered the service Is Now Corporal 
in April 1947 and underwent basic 
training at Fort Lewis, Wash. Ile was 
ordered for overseas duty and depar-
ted for the Far East Command in 
December 1947. Upon his arrival in 
Japan, he was assigned to the 1st 
Cavalry Division. Prior to entering 
service, Cpl. Sudderth was a student 
at Okla. Lane high sehucl. 

With The 8th U. S. Army in Ta-
keyama, Japan—Cpl. Lee H. Sud-
derth, Jr., the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee H. Sudderth Sr., who reside at 
Farwell, has recently been promoted 
to the grade of corporal for his out-
standing work with Company H, 5th 
Cavalry Regiment, 1st Cavalry Di-
vision (Infantry). 

Cpl. Sudderth has been serving as 
communications sergeant and assist-
ant platoon sergeant with Company 
H. He has been instructing other 
men in the use of the radio and field 
telephone. He will be in charge of 
communications for Company H 
when the 5th Cavalry Regiment 
goes on maneuvers in the next few 
weeks. Camp McNair, the 1st Ca-
valry Division maneuver area, is lo• 

19 ARE ADDED TO 
WTSC FACULTY LIST 

RELIGIOUS POPULATION 
The United Nations "Word" lists 

the religoius populations of the vari-
cus groups as follows: Roman Catho-
lic, 339 million; Eastern Greek ortho-
dox, 128 million; Protestant and 
Evangelicals, 136 million; Moham-
medans, 121 million; Confucianists, 
300 million; Buddhists, 150 million; 
Hindus. 230 million; Taoists, 50 mil-
lion; Shintoists, 25 million; and 
Jews, 12 million. 

an. He was sent overseas last May. 
Young May was graduated from Texas now has, in all, 88,443 miles 

the Texieo high school in 1946, en- of passable roads of all types. 
listing in the Air Corps at Clovis on Most rapid progress has been 
May 17, 1948. He had his basic train- Imade in farm-to-market roads, 14,-
ing at Lockland Field, San Antonio 500 miles of which have been financ-
and received advance training at Led by the state highway department 
Chanute Field, Ill. 	 in conjunction with federal aid since 

V-J Day. 
The rigures are from a survey tak-

en by the Bureau of Public Roads at 
the direction of the U. S. Senate. 
Texas statistics were compiled by 
the highway department in coopera-
tion with county road officials. 

Farm-to-market roads are located 

4 
Order Your Coal 

NOW 
Most of the coal mines are already shut 

down by strike. But we can still get good 

Colorado cool by trucking it. We advise 

you to place your orders now for what coal 

you will be needing this winter. 

PLENT Y OF COPPER CARB 

RAY MEARS Feed 
and Produce 

FARWELL, TEXAS 

CANYON—President James P. 
Corbette has announced the addition 
of 14 new faculty members at West 
Texas State College. 

They are: Enilio Caballero, art; 
Truett Smith, Bible and director of 
the Baptist Student Union; J. Wel-
don Butler, Bible and director of the 
Methodist Student center; Earl L. 
Craig, Bible and director of the 
Church of Christ Student center; 
Frances Burba and Gilford Cox, bu-
Mess; Josephine Sage, women's phy-
sical education; Mrs. Hester Ann 
Finley, home economics; Dr. Colbert 
C. Held, geography; Vaughn Vander-
griff, journalism and director of FURNITURE 

REPAIRING 

Our job is to restore furni- 
ture to its original sturdiness 
and usefullness. 

Don't throw that good 
chair away because it is 
weak and wobbly. Bring it 
in to us today. 

R. D. Williams & Son 

Dr. Mary Leone McNeff 

See your way to safe driving with good lights. We will re-

place dead bulbs or adjust sealed beams quickly, effici-

ently and inexpensively. Come in today! Osteopathy — Medicine 
Surgery 

Farwell, Texas 

Office Next Door To Post Office 
KARL'S AUTO CLINIC 

K A RL--BUSTER—S M 0 KEY Phone Farwell 	Night Phone 
2831 	 Clovis 3011 Phone 3941 	 Farwell, Texas 

House Calls 
Day or Night Phone 3211 	Texieo, N. M. 

) C 	 C 	 C 	 C 	 TEXICO ONE DAY ONLY 
SUNDAY, OCTOBER 2nd 

AFTERNOON ONLY-2 p. m—NO NIGHT SHOWS 

	.c 	.c 	.c 	_c 	 	)E 	 

Where to Find and Buy It From 
Friendly CLOVIS Concerns 
The Friendly Firms Listed Below Solicit a Share of 

Your Out of Town Shopping 

W 

—FIRST TIME IN NEW MEXICO 

Stevens Brothers Circus 41,  
C' 

3t 	 C 	 )c 	 	31. 	 .t. 	3E 	 ),. 	 3E  	_C 	)C 	 

ii The 
Vohs Co. 

FIRST 

IN 

FASHION 

418 Main 	Dial 6516 

Jack Holt itr GENUINI SIGISI1RID 

 sake 
THE CLOTHIER ... For Men and Boys 

304 Main 	 Dial 4057 

DIAMOND RINGS 

S 1  
-n 	Mark 	" • .... 

FROM 

Rotate 'int 

Famous For For Diamonds 

Rralis Stacks 
Potraits As You Like Them 

Weddings for Pleasant Memor-
ies — Commercial for Adver-

tising Needs 
216 E. 4th 	Dial 5324 

A BETTER 

DEPARTMENT STORE Dial 7013 

Sisemore Furniture Store DILLON'S 

Shop for the Younger Set 

416 Main 	Phone 6516 
Phone 7534 

For Quality Furniture and Right Prices . . . See Us 

"We Cheat You For Less" 

119 West Grand 

.SHOES FOR THE ENTIRE 
FAMILY 

512 Main 	 Phone 7744 

New Mexico Roofing 
& Sheet Metal Co. 

Lennox Central Heating Systems 
And Air-Conditioning 

121 W. 1st St. 	Phone 4115 

Clovis Sign Service 

Builders NE0NIDesigners 
Manufacturers 

Phones—Bus. 5623, Nite 6639 
911 East Grand 

Pliiitips Gutructrial 

Collrge 
A Business Based on Integrity 
Complete Commercial Trainimr 

Approved for Veteran Training 
3011'.2  Main 	Box 506 	Ph. 3752 

Clovis Drapery Shop 
Draperies 	 Curtains 
Bed Spreads 	Vanity Skirts 
Slip Covers 	Lamp Shades 

Inferior Decorating 
THE VILLAGE Phone 3343 

All New 1949 Program Featuring: 
SANCHEZ FAMILY, direct from Mexico 

(Sensational acrobate and wire artists) 
DEKOHL TRIO—European Jugglers 

VIRGINIA LYNNE-NEILSON SISTERS 
RIGGS DUO—TESSIE VALDEZ 

PAUL BAJAMOS TROUPE OF CLEVER CLOWNS 
BOB GRUBBS LIBERTY HORSES 

DOLLY JACOBS PERFORMING ELEPHANTS 
-Greatest Trained Elephants With Any Show" 

"OKLAHOMA SHORTY" SHERAR and his troupe of 
trick riders and ropers 

STEVENS BROS. PRANCING PONIES, riding dogs and 
monkeys—a treat for the children 

MORE WILD ANIMALS 
THAN EVER BEFORE! 

SEE: Lions, Tigers, Bears, Leopards, Pumas, Apes, 
Monkeys, Llamas, Camels, Elephants. Zebu, Water 

Buffalo4Thar, Gnu, Yak, etc., etc. 

CAGE AFTER CAGE OF WILD ANIMALS 
On display at show grounds at 10 a. m.—FREE 
An education in natural history for the children 

POPULAR LOW PRICES FOR ALL 

NOTE: This is Not A Carnival ... 
No Games—No Gambling Allowed 

Elephants Will Be At Texaco Service Station 
At Noon Circus Day 

Dunn Bros. Motor Co. Clovis Steam Laundry and Dry Cleaning 

Dry Cleaning—Laundry—Fur Service 

Pick-up and delivery service in Texico-Farwell Tuesdays 

and Saturdays 

Service Sales Nash 

WATcnta-PQOOKS 
MOTOR COMPANY 
LINCOLN—MERCURY 

Sales & Service 
Authorized Dealers for Curry, 

Roosevelt. DeBacca Counties. N. 
M.. and Parmer County. Texas 

600 W. 7th 	 Phone 7423 

C We Repair Any Make Automobile 

Phone 7833 	200 Mitchell 

New Mexico Plaining Mill 
Moulded Trim, Cabinets, Doors, 
Window Units & Store Fixtures 

DAN & RAYMOND GRIGGS 

219 Connelly Box 781 Ph. 7842 

Hillcrest Roller Rink 

Mon. Nite reserved for Spanish. 

JASON'S SPORTS AND 
ARMY STORE 

Army Surplus-Sporting Goods 
Service Type Shoes, Boots & 
Clothing, Tents, Tarps and 

Camping Supplies 
?05 W. Grand 	Phone 7752 

Wed Fri. 
Sun. After- 
private par- 

WALKER'S 
Sales PACKARD Service 

General Electric Appliances 

Gulf Petroleum Products 

220 E. 1st St. 	Phone 3511 Phone 4335 

Open to All—Tues.. 
and Sat. Nights and 
noons. Thursday for 
ties only. 
930 Sycamore 

Bigger? Radio Service 
Same Day Service on All Makes 

and Models 

The Laughlin Co. 
1st and Mitchell Sts. 

Cash Buyers Poultry & Eggs 
Full-O-Pep & Merit Feeds 

1 C E 
Phones-6912 and 7823 

CAR AND HOME RADIOS 

114 E. 5th 	 Phone 4024 

O K Rubber Welders 
JAKE SNIPES, Owner 

Tire Recapping, Tire Repairim: 
Our Specialty 

New and Used Tires, Tubes 
301 W. Grand 	Phone 6834 

Skinners' Boot Shop 
Rebuilders and Boot Makers 

SHOE REPAIRING DONE 
WHILE YOU WAIT 

216 Main 	 Phone 3642 

Farmers Hatchery and 
Supply 

Chicks Hatched Every Tuesday 

Started Chicks—Popular Breeds 

Purina Feeds, Remedies, Supplies 

	

217 W. Grand 	Phone 5423 

	7E 	lf 	)E 	- 

WE APPRECIATE YOUR PATRONAGE Clovis Linoleum Shop 
Every Kind of Wall Tile 
Every Kind of Floor Tile 
Every Kind of Linoleum 

LICENSED CONTRACTORS 

MAX MEADORS CO. 
BUICK—CHEVROLET 

24-Hour Wrecker Service 
301 Pile 	 Dial 4466 201-03 W. Grand 6742 

TI 
•tr 	 ^E  	 lf 	)f 	 



YOUR AMMUNITION NEEDS 

See us for your ammunition needs. We have shotgun 
shells in 12, 16, 20 and 410 gauge. Also plenty of .22 
cartridges in shorts, longs and long rifle. 

FOX DRUG STORE 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

SEE US NOW FOR YOUR ... 

Permanent Pasture Grass 
Seeds 

We also have a good stock of binder twine 

on hand. See us before you buy. 

Roberts Seed Company 
Texico—Clovis—Portales 

Give your Dream Kitchen the 

aiffeedia.4 
OF WOOD CABINETS -- 

tant "know-how" that makes ideas glair' 
into a beautiful kitchen for you. Come in 
today. Ask for details on our kitchen plan-
ning service — and your copy of Kitchen 
Maid's famous color booklet containing 
ten model kitchens with floor plans. 

Get the warmth and friendliness of wood 
in that kitchen of your dreams. Get the 
beauty of wood, the quiet dignity, that are 
an invitation to pleasant living. Kitchen 
Maid, first of the modern kitchens, gives 
you all this and more — distinctive Flo-Line 
cabinet styling, non-chipping aluminum 
drawers, non-warping doors with quiet, 
cushioned action, conveniences galore, mod-
erate price. We will supply the all impor- 

ITCHEN MA9 
Fze.sr Abra earme 

ITCHFNS 

KEMP LIMPER COMPANY 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

Steers Run Wild To 
Smother Whitharral  

e 
and Whitharral got a 5-yard penalty. the school said today.  

An incomplete pass was tried and a Indications are that the locals will 
line plunge netted nothing as Terry go into the games as the underdogs, 
came in fast. Whitharral tried to as Coach C. B. Stockton said Tues-
kick out but Dollar blocked the ball day that he understood the Ranch-
and the Steers took over on the 50. valers thus far have a perfect score. 

Pool to Ford was incomplete and Tentative lineup for Friday night 
Terry shot one, with Coburn and puts Tucker on the anouncl. Clark be-
Poteet of Farwell, Westmoreland hind the plate, Gant on first, Hale on 
and Havins all failing to hold the second, White at third, Reed.  in cen-
ball. Terry then broke loose for a 50- .ter field, King in right eld, Brown 
yard touchdown scamper and Ford's in left field, Horton at shortstop and 
kick was true, leaving the count at Doolittle at short center field, Coach 
25-2. 	 Stockton revealed. 

Local Teams Will Go 	FAIR— 
To Ranchvale, 30th 	I 

(Continued from. Page 1) 
Winding up the first month of 1 neth O'Brien, of Friona. 

softball, the Texico teams will play I ; 	Other notables included a 90-year- 
another series of night match, Fri- ;old quilt shown by Mrs. Opal Jones 
day, when they are entertained on of Friona; a 46-year-old pillow case 
the Ranchvael diamond, coaches a.. entered by Mrs. George Stowers o: 

Friona; and a doily, hand-knitted of 
No. 60 white thread, made as a 
wedding gitt for Mrs. W. H. Graham 
of Farwell, by an Oregon friend. 

Outstandingly beautiful was a 
white crocheted luncheon cloth, by 
Mts. M. M. Sherley of Friona, and 
extraordinary hand-made chenille 
bath mats of different designs were 
shown by Mrs. George Reed of Frio-
na . 
Parade Held Saturday 

Climaxing the weekend, a parade 
wound its way through Friona short-
ly after noon Saturday, with a large 
number of entries. 

Little Miss Barbara Lloyd, daugh 
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Fred Lloyd o! 
Friona, practically stole the pet show 
as the 18-months-old girl came 
trudging down main carrying her 
black and white puppy—usually 1:1 
the neck. Two tiny Shetland colt 
were paraded, their size showing up 
even more by contrast with a hug,  
white dog that actually stood higher 
off the ground than the ponies. 

The Friona Band, led by Glenr 
Cunningham, provided music for tht 

/parade, and members of the Here 

ford Riding Club, in matched cos-
tumes and on matched horses, also 
were starred. Cash prizes were pre-
sented winners of the four compet-
ing divisions of the parade. 

In speaking of the fair this week, 
President Dan Ethridge, of the asso-
nation, said that members were al- 

It was just their game. 
And the Farwell Steers went com-

pletely wild, last Friday night, in 
routing the Whitharral Panthers, 
43-2, chalking up the second confer-
ence win of the season for the locals. 
Not only did they score on their own 
playls, they converted pass intercep-
tions into touchdowns---and even 
made the two points allowed Whit-
harral, the result of a bad center 
pass which turned into a safety for 
the visitors. 

Nix was credited with one touch-
down, Terry got three but only two 
were legal as Farwell was offside 
on his 75-yard scamper, Ford went 
into the end zone twice and kicked 
one extra point, Poteet and Coburn 
each had a single six-pointer.. 

Starting off with vim and vigor, 
the Steers had scored within the 
first couple of minutes after play be-
gan„and from there cut they practi-
cally went wild except for a flurry 
of mishaps in the latter part of the 
second period which gave Whithar-
ral a safety count of two points. 

Conversely, the locals were appar-
ently unable to stop the center driv-
ing of Hughes, star Panther back, 
but Hughes just wasn't able to carry 

. the ball all the time, and when his 
teammates tried the toting, the locals 
were up in aunts, 
First Quarter 

Receiving on the opening kickoff, 
Ford grabbed the leather on the 25 
and bulled his way to the 47. Pool 
got 2 and Coburn went across to the 
Panther 47 for a first down. Tern/ to 
Poteet was incomplete and Pool then 
made 7. Sweeping around end, Terry 
scooted for his initial touchdown and 
the conversion try fluke& Score, 6-0. 

Ford booted to the 25 and Hughes 
came back 10 yards. On the next 
play Hughes fumbled and Dollar fell 
on the 36, covering for the Steers. 
Pool made 4, then rushed to the 18. 
Terry to Poteet failed, Pool was on 
clown to the 1-foot market and Nix 
bored over center for the score. Ford 
missed his kick, Score, 12-0. 

Ford's boot went to the 25 and 
again Hughes received, getting to 
the 35. Lewis made 2, then lost 4 
and Hughes was knocked loose from 
the ball with Farwell covering. Co-
burn lost 2 as Westmoreland got in-
to the action, Nix Made 7 and then 
hit it again for 9. Pool to Poteet was 
Ifieoinplete and the ball went over 
on the 30 to Whitharral. Having got 
2 and then met Norton, Burnett was 
dumped by McKillip for a minus 3, 
and. Burnett tried a pass over center 
which Farwell intercepted, taking 
over on the 25 F arwell fumbled and 
covered to lose 4, Poteet went to thq 
'4,2 as the quarter ended. 
Second Quarter • 

Fool chased madly around, shook 
loose twice and leaping almost his 

-own height into the air, shot a pass 
to Ford, waiting with outsretched 
hands in the end zone. Terry's kick 
went to one side. Score, 18-0. 

Farwell kicked off, with Burnett 
being driven out of bounds on his 19. 
Burnett got 8 yards before meeting 
Ford, Hughes hit the center and ad-
vanced to midfield. Buuaett got 8 as 
Pool snared him and Hughes met 
Hughes of Farwell for nothing. Bur-
nett shot a pass to Billings for a first 
down, Hughes failed to gain, Burnett 
pushed on clown to the 19 but the 
play was called back and Whitharral 
assessed 5. Westmoreland dropped 
into the backfield, passing to Bill-
ings, but Terry slapped the ball. Hav-
ins to Westmoreland was also in-
complete but a third try clicked. 
Yardage was insufficient and the 
Steers took over on the 19. 

Poteet fumbled and recovered for 
4 but the locals were offside and got 
fined 5. Raney scooted through for 
10, Poteet slammed on down to mid-
field but again Farwell was offside 
and lost 5. Raney got back 5 and 
lost it on another penalty. Poteet 
tried an incomplete pass on the 23, 
a bad center pass to Nix went over 
his head and he finally covered on 
the 1-foot market, and the second 
bad backward pass to Nix forced him 
out of his own end zone for a Whit-
harral safety. 

Ford kicked off from the 20, with 
Billings receiving on the Steer 42. 
Havins got 5.and Burnett went no,  
where as Coburn nailed him. Hughes 
also drew a blank, and an attempted 
pass from Westmoreland was hit by 
Ford and Poteet who fumbled it in-
to the intended receiver's hands. 
Burnett pt 5 as the half ended. 
Third Cuellar 

Farwell kicked off to the 25 and 
Hughes returned to the 32. Billings 
passed to Westmoreland over center 
with the play reaching the 50. The 
second aerial backfired, as Terry in-
tercepted on the 28. Terry then got 
loose for a beautiful touchdown run 
which was nullified when one of his 
teammates was of;Side. Trying the 
tame play, Terry almost was loose 
again but was stooned for 8, Coburn 
got 3, Pool lost 7 and Nix kicked out 
on the Panther 47. 

Hughes got 3 as Pool drove him to 
the ground, Westmoreland added 4 
aid then went on to the Farwell 47. 
Coburn drove Burnett back for 2 

Ford kicked to the 10, and Hughes 
blasted his way back downfield to 
the 50. Westmoreland tried a pass 
over center which Nix intercepted. 
Terry to Coburn was incomplete 
but Terry got to the 30 as the period 
_ran out. 
Fourth Quarter 

Terry, to Poteet connected on the 
lust play for a counter but Ford's 
kirk was no good. Score, 31-2. 

Farwell kicked, with Burnett fum-
bling back to the 32 before he recov-
ered. Burnett tried a pass which, was 
incomplete and the second short cen-
ter aerial was stolen by Ford who.  
went galloping from the 35 for an-
other Steer touchdown. His kick 
failed and Farwell led, 37-2. 

Kicking again, the Steers sent the 
ball to the 38, Burnett came back to 
the 43, and London slammed Hughes 
for nothing. Burnett got back only 
to the line of Scrimmage and then 
Coburn stepped in to intercept an-
other Panther pass and was off from 
the 50 for his counter. An incom-
plete pass was tried for conversion. 
Score, 43-2. 

Ford's kick was out on the 41 and 
Hughes got one yard before Whit-
harral fumbled with Magness recov-
ering on the 48. Poteet to McKillip 
was incomplete, Raney made 2, Po-
teet to Magness was no good and 
Farwell kicked, with the Panthers 
on their 30. Havins got 2 as Christ-
ian hauled him down, Hughes ad-
vanced to the 42 where he met Nix 
and Pool snared Burnett on the 50. 
Westmoreland reached the Steer 40, 
Raney and McKillip slapped down a 
pass try after Magness had almost 
intercepted the first aerial, and Bur-
nett got 5. Gage reached the 35 and 
the ball went over. Pool tried an in-
complete pass, made 7, Raney lost 5 
as time ran out. 

ready considering plans to enlarge 
the arena for the 1950 showing. 

A complete list of all winners in
various divisions of the show is 

to be found elsewhere in this issue. 
0 	 

Joan of Arc was killed by burning; 
to the stake in 1431. 

See Us For 

GRAIN STORAGE 
WE HAVE PLENTY OF 

TERMINAL STORAGE FOR 

YOUR GRAIN SORGHUMS 

We are paying above loan for wheat now. 

Would like to handle your wheat if you 

want to sell. 

Farwell Elevator Co. 
Ray Ford, Manager 

SPECIALS 
FRIDAY AND SATURDAY 

POP CORN 
10-oz. can 	  

JELLO 
3 packages only..... 	  

COLORED OLEOMARGARINE 
Meadowlake, in quarters, per pound 	  

FLOUR 
Everlite. 25-lb. bag 	  

PORK CHOPS 
Lean, per pound 	  

SHORTENING 
3-lb.. carton 	  

There were 4,523 cotton strippers 
operating in 61 West Texas counties 
last year. And commercial imple-
ment dealers sold 10 thousand rotary 
hoe attachments for the control of ; 
weeds and grass in cotton acreage.I 

16c 

25c 
41c 

$1.69 

63c 
69c 

SUGAR 	49c 5-1b. bag 

COFFEE 
Hill Bros, 11). can._ 54c 

BACON 
Sliced. lb 	  

CHEESE 
American. 

52c 

c lb...........47 

STATE iGiraorc a re  yt LINE  

Coach F. D. Stout was undecided 
almut some positions for his girls, 
but said that P. Engram would be on 
the till with Dosher catching, Rob-
erts at first base, Holland or Reed at 
second, Caldwell - at third, and the 
fielders will be named from J. En-
gram, Vigil, Sparks, Curry, Donahey 
and Allred. 

0  

Rabbi Mairnon, minister of religi-
on for Israel, has asserted that the 
government "will not exercise com-
pulsion over the religious observance 
of its citizens." There had been some 
fear that Israel would become a 
theocratic state. 

PLYMOUTH GREEN-TOP BINDER TWINE 

ALFALFA SEED—BALBOA RYE SEED 

AND WINTER BARLEY SEED 

CERTIFIED SEED WHEAT AS FOLLOWS: 

WESTAR, WICHITA, PAWNEE 

—AND COMMANCHE 

ALSO RECLEANED, TAGGED, TESTED 

WHEAT SEED FROM ABOVE VARIETIES' 

There will be a supply of binder twine at 

the J. A. Grain Company in Lariat 

Your Business Appreciated Very Much 

Henderson Grain & Seed Co. 
Phone 3501 	 Farwell, Texas 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 
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