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Caravan Through Farwell - 

0' 

Tractorcade 
This tractorcade representing Parmer County farmers quietly "invaded" Farwell Tuesday 
in support of the American Agriculture Movement's farm strike. Over 70 tractors and other 
farm equipment were driven through town to call attention to the plight of the farmer. At 
one point the area farmers gathered at the local ASCS office to show their support and 
appreciation of the office and its employees. The mile-long caravan began in Friona, circled 
through Bovina, and following the "march" through Farwell it traveled on to Clovis for a 
demonstration throughout that city. 

American Agriculture 

Stages Demonstration 

Tailfeather Contest - - 

Bovina Man Wins Trophy 
• 10' 

"thus far the national media 
has not really given us much 
publicity." 

Numerous meetings between 
American Agriculture repre-
sentatives and Bergland and 
organizations such as the 
AFL-CIO were to be held this 
week. 

According to the Friona 
farmer, 	many 	farmers 
throughout the United States 
are preparing for the mass 
rally to be held January 18 in 

Washington, D.C. He said their 
prime target will be the 
Congress of the United States. 
"We intend to meet with the 
Congressman in an attempt to 
get our problems across to 
them," he said. 

Autrey said their actions 
and intent are non-violent 
stressing that their only desire 
is to raise parity to 100 
percent. "Anything less than 
that and we cannot survive," 
he said. 

County Livestock Growers - - 

I t Emergency Feed 

Program Available 

third place honors since each 
brought in a tailfeather mea-
suring 24 and 7/16 inches each. 

The prizes in the Friona 
contest were all awarded to 
Friona residents. Dale Schuel-
er took top honors with a 
tailfeather measuring 24 and 
3/4  inches long. In second place 
was S.D. Baize with a 24 5/8 
inch tailfeather. Donnie Gustin 
brought in a 24 and 1,,2 inch 
long tailfeather to take the 
third place honors. 

Awarding the three prizes in 
the Farwell contest were 
Security State Bank, $15; 
Sherley-Anderson-Pitman, $10; 
and Farwell Hardware, $5. 

the first year for the buckle to 
be awarded to the hunter 
securing the longest tailfeath-
er. In past years, a plaque 
was given. 

Third place in Bovina went 
to Donnie Shamblin of Ama-
rillo and Barty Bartlett of 
Bovina who each brought in 
tailfeathers measuring 24 and 
3/4  inches each. 

In the Farwell contest, 
Ralph McClendon of San 
Marcos netted first place with 
a feather 24 and 13/16 inches 
long. Mark Edwards of Austin 
and Roy Dean Lovelady of 
Farwell share the second and 

Following three weekends of 
pheasant hunting last month, 
all the pheasant tailfeathers 
brought in by Parmer County 
hunters have been measured 
and the 1977 winners deter-
mined. 

Jessie Stone of Bovina 
turned in two of the longest 
tailfeathers — 25 and 14 inches 
each — to claim the first and 
second place honors in Bovina. 
He also received the trophy 
belt buckle which the Parmer 
County Game Association will 
present each year at the 
completion of the hunt. The 
buckle features a hand painted 
emblem of a pheasant. It is 

Under the new farm bill, the 
County Agricultural Stabiliza-
tion and Conservation (ASC) 
Committee now has authority 
to implement the Emergency 
Livestock Feed Program 
(EFP), reports Prentice Mills, 
executive director. 

The purpose of this program 
is to assist eligible livestock 
owners by sharing the cost of 
purchasing feed for eligible 
livestock when such feed must 

be purchased in quantities 
above normal. 

The assistance is for the 
preservation and maintenance 
of livestock in any area where 
the County ASC Committee 
determines that an emergency 
exists. ihe emergency could 
be created by drought, hail, 
etc. 

To be eligible under this new 
program, the livestock pro- 

(Continued on Page 2) 

Re-election - 

Benna Felts Announces 

For Treasurer's Post 

individual action. "We are 
asking farmers to lay out 50 
percent of their land or more 
if they can," he said, "but 
each farmer has to decide for 
himself what he can do to 
support the movement." 

Some farmers can afford to 
lay out all of their land, 
Autrey said, but most cannot. 
"Some farmers were holding 
back from joining us because 
they thought a 100 percent 
strike was called for from 
each and every farmer," he 
said. "But when they realized 
that this was not the case, 
many more joined with us to 
protest low prices, etc." 

Autrey said they also want 
to control and operate the 
FDA in order to keep "mar-
kets feasible." He said that 
many farm-related food pro-
cessors and distributors are in 
support of the strike to the 
extenf that many are "cutting 
back or shutting off operations 
and distributioin for the dura-
tion of the strike." Other 
companies shut down tempor-
arily in the beginning in 
support of the strike move-
ment. 

Autrey said they are begin-
ning to attract the attention of 
some of the higher up people 
like President Carter and 
Secretary of Agriculture Bob 
Berglaixl, but he admitted that 

Mrs. Benna Felts, a resident 
of Parmer County since 1946, 
has announced this week that 
she will be a candidate for 
re-election as Parmer County 
Treasurer in the Democratic 
Primary on May 6, 1978. 

In authorizing this newspa-
per to make her announce-
ment, Mrs. Felts made the 

following statement: 
"It has been a pleasure to 

serve as Parmer County 
Treasurer since 1974. I am 
now asking the voters of this 
county to support me for a 
second term. If elected, I will 
continue to devote my full 
time to this office." 

Benna Felts 
Pd. Pol. Adv. 

Clara Belle Smith 

Services Pending 
r. 

rillo. 
Mrs. Smith was born Sept. 9, 

1913, in Lucian, Okla. She and 
her family moved to the 
Claude Community in 1915. At 
the time of her death she was 
a resident in the Pleasant Hill 
Community. She was a mem-
ber of the First Baptist 
Church in Texico. 

Survivors include her hus-
band, Clarence, of the home; 
two daughters, Kathleen Reese 
of Amarillo and Patricia 
Peugh of Amarillo; one son, 
Leon Smith of Texico; three 
grandchildren; one sister, 
Mrs. Joe Burford of Texico; 
and her mother, Mrs. John 
Donahey of Clovis. 

For a short time Tuesday 
afternoon, excitement pre-
vailed in the small community 
of Farwell as Parmer County 
farmers drove more than 70 
tractors and other pieces of 
farm equipment through town 
en route to Clovis. It was the 
first round of Phase III of the 
American Agriculture strike 
which began December 14. 

The "invasion" was peaceful 
though and after driving down 
Third Street, circling around 
the Courthouse and tempor-
arily camping near the local 
ASCS office and along the 
Loop, the farmers mounted 
their vehicles and proceeded 
toward Clovis. 

According to Ron Autrey, 
Friona farmer and spokesman 
for the group, the demonstra-
tion was "simply to call atten-
tion to the plight of the 
farmer." He said the farmers 
involved in the tractorcade 
were from Friona, Bovina, 
Lazbuddie and Farwell. Aut-
rey said that farmers through-
out the United States who sup-
pgrt American Agriculture 
e/V7ed similar demonstrations - 
Ttiesday. The national farm 
strike is going into its fourth 
week. 

The farmers began their 
march in Friona Tuesday 
where they drove through 
town, Autrey said. They also 
drove around Bovina before 
coming to Farwell. 

The caravan which then 
traveled through Texico to 
Clovis along U.S. Highway 
60-70-84 was more than a mile 
in length. Reportedly, addi-
tional tractors joined the line 
of march as the caravan ap-
proached Clovis. The caravan 
was given an escort by the 
Clovis Police Department to 
avoid endangering traffic. 

The route of the tractorcade 
in Clovis was to be west along 
First Street to Main, north on 
Main to 21st Street, east to 
Prince, back along Commerce 
Way to Main, then east on 
First to leave Clovis. 

According to Autrey, the 
farmers were preparing for 
the rally which was to be held 
that night in Friona. 

Autrey also pointed out that 
they made the ASCS office the 
focal point of their demonstra-
tion in Farwell to "show their 
support and appreciation for 
the office and its director, 
Prentice Mills. We wanted to 
show him we appreciate all 
his efforts," Autrey said. 

He called American Agri-
culture the "largest farm 
movement to date" adding 
that it was comprised from 

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Clarence (Clara Belle) Smith 
of Texico, 64, were pending at 
presstime with Steed-Todd 
Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Smith died early Wed-
nesday morning from injuries 
sustained in a two-car crash 
north of Clovis Saturday which 
also claimed the life of her 
two-year-old grandson, Kevin 
Reese of Amarillo, and seri-
ously injured her daughter, 
Kathleen Reese, also of Ama- 

Kevin Reese 

Services Held 
In Amarillo 

Back from the northern 
icebox and home to sunny 
Texas. Coming in last Sunday 
night we were not sure 
whether we were getting into 
Texas or Minnesota. The 
beautiful day Monday told us 
we were home on the Golden 
Spread. 

Some observations on Min-' 
nesota: In the cold country, 
clbthing comfort takes prece- 
dence over style, particularly 

•, in the shoe department. You 
seldom see the ground from 
November to April and snow 
shovels sell big. Motor heaters 
for automobiles and trucks are 
a must if you plan to get 
started in the morning. Beef 
and pork are cheaper. Gaso-
line is about the same but 
natural gas is apparently less 
costly. 

We noted that there was not • 
any stray dogs running loose. 
Guess a few nights at 25 to 30 
below eliminates them. We did 
notice that our pooch shed not 
a hair after an exposure to 
two to below zero. Nature kept 
every one of her few hairs 
firmly attached. 

There was a bunch of people 
who thought that the Vikings 
would beat the Cowboys but 
then those folks believe in the 
tooth fairy, they keep electing 
Hubert Humphry. 

The part of Iowa which we 
came through looked as if it 
would have plenty of snow for 
its winter moisture. This may 
be a reason that apparently 
the farm strike movement was 
not very visible. We did note 
some farm strike signs in 
Oklahoma, none in Missouri 
and one lone tractor parked on 
a freeway overpass in Iowa. 
But then just passing through 
hardly qualifies us as any sort 
of expert on local feeling. 

set.. 

We did witness the Ameri-
can Agriculture Movement 
tractorcade through Farwell 
and Texico Tuesday. It was 
certainly impressive and quite 
visible. It also was very • 
orderly and only minimally 
interrupted traffic. We appre-
ciated the farmers show of 

▪ solidarity and strength but 
• tended to think that it was a 

misplaced effort. 
Shucks folks, we're on your 

side for higher prices. It's 
those big city dudes and the 
Congressmen they elect that 
are making it tough on the 
farmer and small business-
man. After all, most of the 
businesses out in this country 
are run by individuals trying 
to make a living also. So to a 
very large degree the same 
economic factors hurting the 
farmer are also hurting the 
man in town. 

For openers, these economic 
factors suggest federally fo-
istered inflation. Excessive 
union labor contracts. Govern-
mental rules, regulations and 
red tape. And probably just as 
important, neither of us have 
well-organized well-financed 
publicity and lobby groups 
speaking with one voice for 
our interests. 

We, too, favor 100% of 
parity for farm products, but 
we believe that it can and 
should be achieved through 
the workings of the free 
enterprise system and not by 
government fiat. 

Parity, as we understand it, 
is figured from a base period 
of 1910 to 1914. It occurs to us 
that at that time in our 
national history "free enter-
prise" was the dominant 
political 	and 	economic 
thought. During this period, it 
is said, farmers enjoyed the 
best balance between what 
they bought and what they 
sold. 

Well it would seem that one 
goal might be to return to the 
economic conditions that pro-
duced this favorable farm 
position. We think that the 
demand for 100% of parity 
-should not take the route of 
'asking for 100% government 
*domination and control of 
'agriculture, but quite the 
'contrary, the demand should 
be for 100% economic freedom 
for the farmer and his 
businessman companion. 

Free us both from the 
(Continued on Page 2) 

Jim Hughes Buried 

Tuesday In Texico 
Funeral services for Jim 

Hughes, 76, of Texico were 
conducted Tuesday, Jan. 3, at 
10 a.m. at Hamlin Memorial 
United Methodist Church in 
Farwell with Rev. Russell 
Martin, pastor, officiating. 
Burial was in the Texico 
Cemetery under the direction 
of Steed-Todd Funeral Home. 

Mr. Hughes died December 
30 at Clovis Memorial Hospi-
tal. He was born in Indian 

Funeral Services for Kevin 
Reese, 2, were conducted at 2 
p.m. CST Tuesday from the 
Temple Baptist Church in 
Amarillo with the Rev. Clay-
ton Watson, interim pastor, 
officiating. Burial was in 
Llano Cemetery in Amarillo 
under the direction of School-
er-Gordon Funeral Directors 
of Amarillo. 

He died Saturday afternoon 
in a two-car accident near 
Clovis. The child was born 
Aug. 5, 1975. 

Survivors include the par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Edwin 
Reese of Amarillo; grandpar-
ents, Mrs. G.T. Reese of 
Amarillo and Clarence Smith 
of Pleasant Hill; three half-
sisters, Mrs. Angela Oliver of 
Amarillo and Mrs. Anita 
Olivarez and Miss Jamie Lynn 
Reese of Holly Spring, Miss. 

JIM HUGHES 

Territory on April 10, 1901, 
moving to Texico in 1926 
where he had lived ever since. 
He was a member of the local 
Methodist Church. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Saleeta of the home in Texico; 
two sons, Pete Hughes of Iowa 
Park, Tex., and Hollis Hughes 
of Haskell, Tex; nine grand-
children and onP great-grand-
child. 

Pallbearers were Vane 
Dosher, Jacky Billingsley, 
Danny Ray Billingsley, Butch 
Billingsley, T.J. Kittrell and 
Truman Kittrell. 

Honorary pallbearers were 
Howard Billingsley, Billy Joe 
Winegeart, L.L. McMath, 
Charles Lovelace, Edward En-
gram and Bill Hagler. 

Peaceful Demonstration 
Farmers from Friona, Bovina, Lazbuddie and Farwell staged a demonstration in Farwell 
Tuesday to emphasize the farmer's strike which began December 14. They are asking for 
100 percent parity. The local rally was one of many held throughout the United States in 
support of American Agriculture. Following the peaceful demonstr 	the frIrm-Qrs 
proceeded to Clovis where they staged another demonstration, one of many held in the 
nation that day. A massive rally is scheduled to be held in Washington, D.C. January 18. 
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Be an early bird! 

BUY NOW AND 
GET CASH BACK! 

Pay no finance charges until the season of use. 

Be an early bird now and you can save two 
ways on most new Massey-Ferguson farm 
tractors, implements and harvesting 
equipment. 

PAY NO FINANCE CHARGES. 
That's right, if you finance through Massey-
Ferguson Credit Corporation, all finance 
charges are waived until the following 
season of use: 

CASH BACK. You get cash back from 
Massey-Ferguson based upon the cash paid 
on the purchase, and on the reasonable 
trade-in allowance. MF will send you a 
check when purchase is completed. 

Season of Use 
Corn and Bean Combines 	. Sept. 1, 1978 
Grain Harvesting Equipment ....Aug. 1, 1978 
Hay Harvesting Equipment.....June 1, 1978 
Tractors and Implements . ...... April 1, 1978 

These early bird deals are limited to available 
inventory and end January 27, 1978. 

Come in and see us now while we still have a good selection. 

MF Clovis Farm Center Massey Ferguson 

North of Clovis Ph. 762-3726 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM -- 
LARGE SELECTION 
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1978 Cotton Program Provisions Announced 
Deficiency payments under 

the 1978 cotton, wheat and 
feed grain programs combined 
are limited to $40,000.00 per 
person in 1978. Disaster pay-
ments are excluded from 
payment limits. Of course, 
loans are not subject to any 
limitation. 

Michelangelo carved his fa 
mous statue of David from a 
marble block on which anoth-
er sculptor had started work. 

eftINA nut 

Farwell Council Hikes 

Schools' Water Rates 

ter payment rate for 1978 is 
17.3 cents per pound — 
one-third of the target price. 
Disaster payments are paid if 
the producer is prevented 
from planting upland cotton or 
other program crops or if his 
yield is substantially reduced 
due to circumstances beyond 
his control. 

Prevented planting pay-
ments can be made on the 
acreage intended to be planted 
— not to exceed the acreage 
planted in 1977. Payment is 
made on 75% of the estab-
lished farm program payment 
yield on the acreage approved 
for prevented planting. 

For low yields, payment is 
made on any production loss 
below 75% of the program 
payment yield multiplied by 
the acreage planted for har-
vest on the farm. 

If the national average price 
received by farmers for up-
land cotton during calendar 
year 1978 falls below the 
target price, cotton producers 
will receive a deficiency 
payment at a rate equal to the 
difference between the higher 
of the average market price 
for calendar year 1978, or the 
loan level of 44 cents. 

For Example-: If average 
market is 46 cents per 'pound, 
the deficiency payment would 
be at 6 cents per pound. 52 
cents-46 cents = 6 cents. Now, 
if average market price is 42 
cents, the deficiency payment 
would be 8 cents. 52 cents 
minus the loan rate of 44 cents 
= 8 cents. 

The target price is also used 
as a base to determine 
disaster payments. The disas- 

There will be no set-aside 
requirements under the 1978 
Upland Cotton Program, ac-
cording to Prentice Mills, 
executive director of Parmer 
County Agricultural Stabiliza-
tion and Conservation Service. 

Other provisions are: 
A target price of 52 cents 

per pound. 
A National Program Acre-

age of 10,248,000 acres. 
A 20% voluntary acreage 

reductioin. 
No land diversion payments 

and no limitation on planted 
acres. 

A 1978 loan rate of 44 cents 
per lb. on Strict Low Middling 
1-1/16 (Mike 3.5 thru 4.9) at 
average U.S. location. 

The target price provides 
cotton producers a national 
average income protection of 
52 cents per pound. 

Farwell City Council in-
creased the water rates for 
Farwell Schools during its 
regular meeting on Tuesday, 
Dec. 27. The new rates have 
been raised to 30 cents per 
1,000 gallons after the first 
4,000 gallons. Under the old 
rates the school paid only 15 
cents per 1,000 gallons. 

According to Janie Bowery, 
city clerk, the action was 
deemed necessary because the 
city was losing money at the 
old rate. "Now we can break 
even," she said. 

Paul Haden met with the 
Council in regard to setting up 
an indoor shooting range in 
the back of his shop which is 
now located in the old theatre 
building. He said that only 
target loads would be used 
and the operation would be 
supervised at all times. Cur- 

DAILY SPECIALS 
FRIED OYSTERS 	'2.75 
CHICKEN FRIED STEAK 	'265  
MERCHANT STEAK 	 '265  

SALAD BAR, BAKED POTATO & CORN 
PORK CHOW MEIN w/EGG 100 YUNG . 	.52.75 

BANQUET FACILITIES 
CHINESE, AMERICAN, MEXICAN FOOD 

HIWAY60-70-84 	PHONE 763-4823 	CLOVIS, N.M. 

The 10,248,000 National Pro-
gram Acreage (NPA) could be 
revised later (cannot be less 
than 10,000,000) for the pur-
pose of determining the Na- 
tional 	Allocation 	Factor. 
(NAF) 

The NAF (not to exceed 
100%) will be determined 
later by dividing the final 
NPA by the national harvested 
acreage of the 1978 crop. For 
Example: Harvested acreage 
12,500,000 divided into the NPA 
of 10,248,000= .8198 Allocation 
Factor. 

Take a farm with 102 acres 
of cotton planted who earns a 
deficiency payment. The acres 
for deficiency payment would 
be 102.0 X .8198 = 83.6 acres 
eligible for deficiency pay-
ment. 

In this Example, keep in 
mind that all the acreage is 
eligible for disaster payments 
and loan. Also, if the 102 acres 
planted in 1978 is at least 20% 
less than 1977, all the 102 
acres would be eligible for 
deficiency payment. 

Jan. 8-11 - 

rent plans call for the facility 
to be open to all clubs and 
organizations, etc. 

The Council requested de-
tailed drawings of Haden's 
plans before making a final 
decision. No other action was 
taken at the time. 

The Commissioners then 
met with city employees Doug 
Landrum and Jack Landrum 
in executive session. Following 
the special conference, it was 
announced that Doug Landrum 
would retire in the near future 
and that Jack Landrum would 
assume his duties with a raise 
in pay. 

Attending the meeting were 
Mayor Walter Kaltwasser, 
commissioners Fred Chandler 
and Johnny Curtis, and city 
employees Ronnie Mitchell, D. 
Landrum, J. Landrum and 
Mrs. Bowery. 

Nat'l FB Convention 

Scheduled In Houston 
I 

I 

Grandson Dies In Albuquerque 

1918 Ford Fairmont Futura 	Stock No. 2132 

$ 1 ^ 1U016 
Per MO. 	2 Dr., bucket seats, 6 cyl., 

3 speed, dark jade metallic 

made to have a National 
Organizational Director pre-
sent for a membership break-
fast. 

President John Hadley ap-
pointed James Williams and 
Gorman Byrd to serve with 
him on the Political Education 
and Legislative Committee. 
These men will attend the 1978 
Legislative Session in Santa 
Fe and monitor all legislation 
affecting agriculture. 

Hoyt Pattison, legislator 
from this area, reported on 
the recent gas hearing held in 
Santa Fe and the success of 
retaining the Priority 2 in the 
revised schedule for gas used 
to power agricultural irriga-
tion wells. 

The National Farm and 
Livestock Bureau Convention 
will be held in Houston, Jan. 
8-11. Plans for taking a 
chartered bus load of Curry 
farmers and ranchers was 
discussed by the Curry County 
Farm and Livestock Bureau 
Board of Directors at their 
December meeting. Eddie 
Harrington of Texico will be in 
charge of making arrange-
ments. 

January 15-21 has been 
designated "Farm Bureau 
Week" in New Mexico with a 
county membership drive to 
follow during the week of 
January 21-28. Allen Kelley 
will be chairman of the drive, 
assisted by Hubert Qualls and 
Helen Kelley. Plans are being 

Funeral services were con-
ducted Friday, Dec. 30, at 
French Mortuary in Albuquer-
que for Tommy Charles Har-
lan, 33, grandson of Mrs. 
Lillian Benderman of Texico. 

Young Harlan died Wednes-
day at his home in Albuquer-
que following a lengthy illness. 

The son of Billy C. and 
Leona M. Harlan of Rota, 
Spain, Harlan was born in 
Clovis and spent many years 
there off and on while his 
father was in the Air Force. 
He attended school there his 
sophomore year in high 
school, but graduated from 
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Cash Selling Price of 54,310 	DOWN PAYMENT 5400 plus tags, 

APR. 13.51% 	 tax & title 

With approved credit 	Your monthly payment will be will be '106.16 

Commissioners Discuss 
Public Transportation 

Total amount of your payment will be '5,095" 

(48 months) 

high school at Wichita Falls, 
He was a surgical technician 
and had lived and worked at 
Albuquerque for about eight 
years. 

Survivors besides Mrs. Ben-
derman and his parents are 
his wife, Donna; a sister, 
Margaret Feraone of New 
York; a brother, Larry Harlan 
of Albuquerque; another 
grandmother, Orel Harlan of 
Austin; four uncles, an aunt, 
and three nephews and one 
niece. I 

Burial was in the National 
Cemetery at Santa Fe. HAGELGANTZ 

Feed Program S S S 

(Continued from Page 1) 
ducer must: 

A. Have suffered a substan-
tial loss in livestock feed 
normally produced on the 
owner's farm(s) for eligible 
livestock. A substantial loss is 
defined as being at least 40 
percent below normal. 

B. Not have sufficient feed 

BIG COUNTRY 
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A report on a kecent joint 
meeting of Farm and Live-
stock Bureau members with 
the New Mexico Cattle Grow-
ers in Albuquerque was given 
by Hadley. Russell Downey 
and Johnny Hopkins of Curry 
County also attended the 
meeting. 

The plans are to organize a 
New Mexico Beef Council. 
Hoyt Pattison was asked to 
introduce the bill which would 
allow a state Beef Referendum 
to be held. The New Mexico 
Livestock Board would be 
responsible for collecting the 
money from the sale of cattle. 
The money will remain in the 
state for the use of the New 
Mexico Beef Council for beef 
promotion. 

A history of the Curry 
County Farm Bureau will be 
included in the High Plains 
Historical Society's book on 
the county. Several members 
of the CCFLB will work on 
compiling the material. 

Eddie Harrington was 
named by the group as their 
nominee to represent Curry 
County on the Eastern Plains 
Community Action Agency 
Multi-County Board. 

Tire representative for the 
Bureau will be Bill Rains of 
Melrose who guaranteed sev-
en-day service to the organiza-
tion. 

A plaque was displayed 
which was presented to Quneil 
Roark at the state NMFLB 
convention for being the best 
Information Director in the 
state in 1977. 

I 
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A letter from George C. 
Wall, Jr. of the Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation was discussed at the 
December 21 meeting of the 
Parmer County Commission-
ers Court. The letter had to do 
with the proposed state and 
federal highway construction 
for the ensuing 20 years. Farm 
to Market roads, state fi-
nanced primary, secondary 
and state projects, recrea-
tional projects, federal-urban 
systems and federal miscel-
laneous projects are not in-
cluded in this proposal. 

The Court also discussed 
changes in the Texas County 
and District Retirement Sys-
tem, which is considered to be 
advantageous to all employ-
ees. 

Extension Office personnel 
joined and served the Com-
missioners Court a noon meal 
in the county courtroom. 
Following the meal, slides ,Cf,  
the extension programs were 
shown. The Court wishes to 
thank Mack Heald, Laura 
Jacobs and Julie Lingnau. 

Jerry Brown met with the 
Court concerning soil compac-
tion. Ernest Anthony of Pre-
cinct 1 is considering one mile 
of this work within his 
precinct. 

The Commissioners decided 
to take a $40,000 certified 
depost to the Right-of-Way 
Fund and to reinvest it in 
another certified deposit for a 
period of six months. 

The salary schedule for 1978 
was approved. 

CLOVIS 
SHOPPING 

DIRECTORY 

for eligible livestock for the 
feeding period, and: 

C. Be required to make feed 
purchases for eligible livestock 
in quantities larger than 
normal. 

Under this new program, 
eligible producers may be 
reimbursed for up to 50 
percent of the cost of the feed 
purchased for eligible live-
stock. The County ASC Com-
mittee determines eligibility 
on a case-by-case basis. 

If a livestock farmer suffers 
a disaster, he should contact 
the County ASCS Office and 
file an application for emer-
gency feed assistance. Appli-
cations must be filed by 
January 31, 1978. 

Of course, applicants under 
all programs administered by 
ASCS are given equal consi-
deration without regard to 
race, color, sex, creed, or 
national origin. 

Purely 

Personal • • • 

just Found 

-4-a, most FANTViC 

Sefect.on of 

WEDDING STATIONERY 

1' 

McPherson 

ivkvitations 	cicry 

price range 
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AUCTION SALES 
Thurs. 1:30 P.M. 

MENNELI'S AUCTION 
108 Sycamore - 162-2581 

(Continued from Page 1) 
stagnating grip of socialism 
and welfareism. The American 
capitalistic free enterprise sy-
stem has produced more 
abundance for more people 
than any system ever devised. 
Let us ask to return to it, not 
to the proven failure of 
socialism.  ROTHWELL BODY SHOP 

1814 West 7th [Behind Chief's Automotive] MIAs, N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 For Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

CABLE TV IS THE BEST TV 

MIDWEST VIDEO CORP. PRINCE FURNITURE 
New G Used Furniture 

1511 N. Prince 
Ph. 702-0092 	 Clovis, N.M. 
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It is common knowledge that the eye of the physical body regulates 

the motion of the body. The golf player must have the ability to keep his 

eye on the ball in order to make his strokes most effective. The scorer in 
the basketball game is said to have a good eye for the basket. We must 
have an object distinctly in view in order to regulate physical action in 
relationship to that object. The Master Teacher understood this truth and 
used it to illustrate the importance of the correct spiritual focus. "If the 
eye is single (sound, functioning as it should), your whole body shall be 
full of light." When the eye is sound, our physical action will be regular 
and steady. When the spiritual eye, which is the mind, is correctly 
focused, our manner of life will be regular and steady, too. 

It is generally agreed that the things which make up the center of our 

attention control the course of our lives. Just as the ability to focus our 
physical sight well is essential to satisfactory physical action, the ability 

to focus our spiritual sight correctly is essential to satisfactory living. In 

other words, we must set our minds on that which is true, wholesome, 

honorable, and just. 

What we see and how well we see it regulates our manner of life. 

The 
Consumer 
Alert 

by John L. Hill 
Attorney General 

1911 Ford Granada 1 Dr Sports Coupe 

OPEN 24 
NOUNS 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

0111110•1 114 -1J1)  ALM'S 
13 THE 
BEST11 CONVENIENCE STORES 

SPECIALS GOOD 
JAN. 5,6 11 7. 

1978 

INVENTORY 
REDUCTIONS!! 
PRICES REDUCED 10% UP TO 50%1 

1 Lb. Shurfresh 

BACON 99' 

MONSTER COOKIES 
Barna 	32 Oz. 

STRAWBERRY JAM 69' 	4/$1.00 
Shurfine 32 Oz. 

SYRUP 
HOT COOKED FOODS 

39' • BR CHICKEN 	• BR RIBS 

Rath 

SAUSAGE 

• HOT LINKS 	• MILD LINKS 
• BURRITOS 	, • CORN DOGS 

49' .6ERMAII SAUSAGE *BULK BID BEEF 
• BIM BEEF SANDWICHES 

SHOP THE FRIENDLY, CONVENIENT • 
ALLSUP'S STORE NEAR YOUI 

Shurfresh 
FRANKS 49' 	 
12 Oz. Wilson 

BOLOGNA 	69' 
Shurfresh 

MARGARINE 4/$1.00 
Fisher's Spanish or Party 

12 Oz. Can 

PEANUTS 	49' 
FORD 

701 Ave. A Farwell 
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Spelling Bee Winner 

To Get Scholarship 
Students in the four-state 

area assigned to the Amarillo 
Globe-News for sponsorship of 
the annual Spelling Bee con-
test now have an opportunity 
to compete for a scholarship 
to West Texas State Univer-
sity. 

In addition to the area's top 
contestant receiving an all-
expense paid trip to Washing-
ton, D.C. (for two), courtesy 
of the Amarillo Globe-News, 
the young student who finishes 
in first place will be given a 
$200 scholarship to West Texas 
State University. 

The announcement was made 
by the Bee Coordinator, Gene 
Parker, director of placement 
at the university. WTSU co-
sponsors the annual Spelling 
Bee competition with the 
Amarillo newspaper. 

The rules for competition 
are established by the national 
sponsors, the Scripps-Howard 
Newspapers, under the direc- 

sounds too good to be true and 
resist all high-pressure or 
deceptive sales tactics, 
including "last chance" deals 
and bait-and-switch selling. 

-Examine merchandise 
carefully before buying, to be 
sure it's what you need and 
want and that it's in good 
condition. 

-Follow manufacturer's 
instructions and care labels, to 
get the best service or wear 
from each product, so you can 
use it longer with greater 
satisfaction. 

-Don't waste your money 
dealing with itinerants for 
goods or services because you 
may not get what you pay for. 
Deal instead with established 
firms or individuals who stand 
behind their offers. 

-Never pay money based on 
oral promises—always "get it 
in writing." 

-Never sign a contract if you 
haven't read and understood 
each word and filled in all 
blanks. 

-Turn down all chances to 
invest in speculative deals 
unless you have checked them 
out with reliable, knowledge-
able persons, and never 
commit motley you cannot 
afford to lose to such 
investments. 

-Plan as a family or as an 
individual on practical ways to 
cut your energy consumption. 

-Plan food purchases to 
avoid buying expensive, 
unneeded "filler" foods which 
supply little nutrition. 

-Try to settle any consumer 
problems you have with the 
firm or person involved. If that 
doesn't work, contact the 
Attorney General's Consumer 
Protection Division in Austin, 
Houston, Dallas, San Antonio, 
El Paso, Lubbock, or McAllen. 
Outside those areas, call this 
toll-free number: 1-800-252-
9236. 

elementary students to com-
pete is the Junior Bee, for 
boys and girls in the sixth and 
lower grades. Each county 
may select a champion in this 
divisions; however, this Junior 
county winner will not com-
pete in regional unless he/she 
wins both titles. 

The 1977 Junior champion 
was Sharla Stewart, also of 
Farwell. 

All county winners, as well 
as county Junior winners, will 
be guests of the sponsors at a 
luncheon preceding the 30th 
Regional Bee on April 29 in 
Amarillo. 

Special awards will go to the 
county winners and each 
Junior county winner will be 
recognized. Certificates, suit-
able for framing, are available 
from the newspaper to every 
contestant, beginning at the 
classroom level. 

Mrs. Jeane Bartlett is the 
Amarillo Globe-News Spelling 
Bee Editor. 

The 1978 National Spelling 
Bee will be held during the 
week of June 4. 

tion of Jim Wagner. Any 
student who has not reached 
his/her 16th birthday or gone 
beyond the eighth grade at the 
end of the current school 
term, is eligible to compete. 

The AGN-WTSU area in-
cludes 29 Texas counties; 10 
from Oklahoma, four from 
New Mexico and three from 
Kansas. 

The 1978 director for Par-
mer County is Herman Con-
nor, Principal, Bovina Junior 
High School. 

The director has full control 
in planning and conducting his 
county event. 

Most schools use the booklet 
prepared by the national spon-
sors, "Words of the Cham-
pions." The word list is 
available from the Amarillo 
Globe-News for 30 cents each. 
To obtain the booklet, please 
write to: Spelling Bee Editor 
Amarillo Globe-News, P.O. 
Box 2091, Amarillo, Tx. 79166. 

The 1977 champion from 
Parmer County was Janie 
Cantu from Farwell. 

A unique opportunity for 
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FIRE 
CALLS 

principal's office. 
s••.. 

Texico City Council will 
meet Tuesday, Jan. 10, at 6:30 
p.m. MST in the City Hall. 

Farwell Convalescent Center 
Auxiliary will meet today 
(Friday) at 2:30 p.m. CST in 
the dining room of the Center. 

Texico Chamber of Com-
merce will meet Monday, Jan. 
9, at 6:30 p.m. MST in the 
community building. 

Parmer County Commis-
sioners Court will convene 
Monday, Jan. 9, at 11 a.m. 
CST in the county courtroom. 

see.. 

Farwell School Board will 
conduct its regular meeting 
Monday, Jan. 9, at 8 p.m. CST 
in the superintendent's office. 

Texico School Board will 
meet Tuesday, Jan. 1G, at 7 
p.m. MST in the high school 

Farwell Volunteer Fire De-
partment reported one ambu-
lance call and four fire calls 
for the past two weeks. On 
December 21 the ambulance 
transported a local resident to 
the hospital in Clovis. On 
December 23 they battled two 
grass fires; one located in the 
alley of 400 Third Street and 
the other three and one-half 
miles out on the Amarillo 
Highway. On December 25 
they were called to a grass 
fire at 111 Manana and on 
December 30 they answered a 
call to a grass fire three miles 
out on the Amarillo Highway. 

Texico Volunteer Fire De-
partment answered two am-
bulance calls and one fire call 
the past two weeks. On 
December 23 and December 
30, the ambulance transported 
local residents to the hospitals 
in Friona and Clovis. 

On December 27, the fire 
units extinguished a small 
blaze at the F.E. Autrey 
place. The fire occurred be-
tween the fireplace and the 
wall, but only slight damage 
was reported. 
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AUSTIN—Many Texas 
consumers overspent their 
budgets during the recent 
holiday buying season. If, like 
so many others, you are now 
staring at a tall stack of bills 
and a short stack of dollars, it's 
time to re-examine your 
individual or family fiscal 
policies. 

Our Consumer Protection 
Division attorneys frequently 
see the results of improper 
consumer planning for 
holiday buying—problems 
with stores over bills, 
difficulties with debt 
collectors, unsuccessful 
attempts to return merchan-
dise that should not have been 
bought in the first place. They 
find that on occasion 
consumers who consistently 
live beyond their means need 
protection. not from others, 
but from themselves and their 
own spending habits. 

In order to avoid the post-
Christmas letdown a pile of 
unpaid debts can bring, not 
only to you but to your 
creditors, start revamping. 
Our attorneys suggest that you 
resolve to do the following in 
the New It ear: 

-Keep a one-week record of 
all expenses to learn where 
your money really goes. 

-Organize shopping and buy 
only from a prepared list, 
avoiding impulse buying. 

-Purchase first for necessi-
ties, then for luxuries. 

-Plan ahead for big items 
you'll need, then save up for 
them and avoid paying 
interest and carrying charges. 

-Decide what you can afford 
to spend on a major item in 
advance and refuse to exceed 
your limit. 

-Comparison shop for 
prices, quality, warranty, and 
finance charges. 

-Study advertising carefully 
before responding to it. 

-Look for a catch if an offer 

School Lunch 
Schedule 
At Texico 

I 	SHERIFF'S REPORT 
History tells of an ancient 

Roman emperor who tried to 
beat the heat by sending 
fleet-footed slaves to bring 
him fresh snow from the 
mountain tops to eat. 

about $400 in damages to 
Cattletown, located near Sum-
merfield. He said the Hereford 
youth will be charged with 
destruction of property. 

In Bovina, Sheriff Lovelace 
said that someone forced a 
window on the Leno Contreros 
home and gained entry into 
the house. Since the family is 
not home, he said they are not 
sure what he has taken. He 
said he expects them to return 
in a few days. 

Sheriff Lovelace reported 
that Ada Salinas, 33, of 
Mathis, Tex., has been picked 
up by Presidio, Tex., authori-
ties on a Parmer County 
warrant. Salinas, who is 
wanted in connection with the 
rape of a young girl south of 
Bovina a few months ago, was 
arrested at the Custom's 
Station near Presidio, accord-
ing to Sheriff Lovelace. He is 
to be returned to Parmer 
County jail in a few days. 

MONDAY - Meat loaf 
with catsup, mashed pota-
toes, green beans, cole-
slaw, hot rolls, butter, 
milk. 

TUESDAY - Hot dogs 
with chili, potato salad, 
peach cobbler, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Pinto 
beans, hot tamales, but-
tered spinach, pickles, 
onions, peanut butter 
cookies, corn bread, but-
ter, milk. 

THURSDAY - Hambur-
gers with relish, cheese 
slices, potato chips, but-
tered corn, cake, peaches, 
milk. 

FRIDAY - Roast beef 
and gravy, scalloped pota-
toes, green beans, lettuce 
and tomato salad, hot 
rolls, butter, milk. 

[Menu Sponsored By 
Borden's Milk ) 

MONDAY — Salisbury steak, 
buttered rice, carrot and 
raisin salad, hot rolls, fruit, 
milk. 

TUESDAY — Hot dogs with 
chili, onions and pickles, 
French fries, cobbler, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Chili beans, 
coleslaw, macaroni and toma-
toes, cornbread, half orange, 
milk. 

THURSDAY 	Meat loaf 
with catsup, buttered potatoes, 
celery stick, hot rolls, fruit 
gelatin, milk. 

FRIDAY — Enchiladas, but-
tered corn, lettuce salad, loaf 
bread, mixed fruit, chocolate 
milk. 
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Parmer County Sheriff Char-
les Lovelace reported that his 
department has been investi-
gating the theft of gasoline 
from the Larry Scott farm 
northeast of Bovina and the 
Clifton Harper place in Fri-
ona. 

He said the culprits' vehicle 
got stuck on the Scott farm 
and that they used Scott's 
pickup to try and get it free. 
But when the car would not 
navigate they left it near the 
Scott place. According to 
Lovelace those involved will 
be charged with theft and 
illegal use of the pickup. 

Sheriff Lovelace said one 
juvenile involved with the case 
has received ten days deten-
tion, adding he was the same 
person who was involved with 
similar cases in Hereford and 
the shootout which occurred in 
Texico several weeks ago. 

Gilbert Rodriguez of Friona, 
19, another suspect in the 
gasoline theft has been ar-
rested and bond was set at 
$1000, according to Sheriff 
Lovelace. He has been bound 
over for grand jury action. 

In another case, Sheriff 
Lovelace reported that a 
juvenile was to be picked up 
this week in connection with 

, 
Pretinished Paneling 	43.97 & Up 

PREFINISHED MOULDING & COLORED NAILS 

4x8 1/2 Sheetrock 	 42.72 
Masonry Cement 	 $3.00 
Storm Windniat 	 421.50 

Portland Cement 	 13.25 

FREE DELIVERY TO 
TEXICO & FARWELL 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

, 1201 E. First 	763-4437 	 Clovis 

9 	Stock No. 3213 $5,09 
White, 302 V8 Sports Coupe Package 

WSW Tires, PS, PB, AC, AM-FM Stereo Radio 

12 mo. or 12,000 mile additional warranty 

BIG COUNTRY 

CLOVIS 111111 

, 0 	HAGELGANTZ 

PERFORMS 
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Assistant Parmer County Extension Agent 
for Home Economics 
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ALL MERCHANDISE SUBJECT TO PRIOR SALES. QUANTITIES 
LIMITED TO STOCK ON HAND A ' 

The second annual Christ-
mas party at Farwell Con- 
valescent Center was a "big 
success" reports Floe Cope-
land, activities director, who 
added that approximately 200 
people attended. Santa Claus 
(Dutch Quickel in reality) paid 
a special visit to residents, 
family members and visitors. 
Besides dispensing good cheer 
to all, he also helped to hand 
out gifts and the stockings. 

The choir from St. John 
Lutheran Church sang carols 
and led everyone in singing 
along as well. John Turner, 
choir director, played the 
piano. 

Auxiliary members in their 
red jackets were also present 
to assist Santa with handing 
out gifts. In addition they 
provided refreshments of 
cookies and punch. 

Mrs. Copeland extends 
thanks and a belated Merry 
Christmas greeting to all the 
Auxiliary members who 
helped with the party. 

The Center staff also had its 
Christmas party last month. 
Entertainment was provided 
by the "Mosquito" band from 
Cannon Air Force Base. 
Names were also drawn and 
gifts were exchanged. Every-
one brought their favorite dish 
for the meal which was 
attended by about 60 persons. 

HOUSEWARES 

4. 

• 
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DOES NOT INCLUDE MICROWAVE 

OVENS OR VACUUM CLEANERS 20% OFF 
REG. PRICE 	SALE QUANTITY 	MODEL 

Fire Generations 
Five generations of the Dickinson family are pictured in this 
photo taken during the holidays at Farwell Convalescent 
Center where Nina Dickinson, seated, resides. Other 
members in her family include, standing, Mrs. Dickinson's 
son, Grover, of Tucumcari; her daughter, Betty Sanders, also 
of Tucumcari; her grandson, Ronald Sanders, and 
great-granddaughter, Sara Jo Sanders, both of Peuaukee, 
Wis. Several years ago Mrs. Sanders was featured in another 
five generations picture involving different members of the 
family. 

7 Fransus Travel Convertor Kit TK7 	 28.95 	16.95 
Fransus Travel Convertor 	  15.95 	7.88 

Case & Buck Knives 	 20 Percent Off 
100 Jute 10 Lb. Ball 	  5.99 	4.49 

165.00 6 Rinse & Vac Carpet Cleaners (used) 
2 lntertherm Heaters EP 300 	 89.95 	54.95 
3 lntertherm Heaters EP 500 	 94.95 	59.95 
Humidifier for Furnace Installation Motor Assembly Missing 	87.95 	29.95 

HARDWARE & FIREPLACE GROUP 
16 Brass 2" Plate Caster For Carpet 
Kirsch Drapery Hdwe 	 
ILCO Cabinet Hardware 	 

28 Warps Storm Window Kit 	 
18 Warps Storm Door Kit 	 72c 	49c 
Harts Glass Fire Screens Black & Brass 29inx371/2in W. 28irix511/2in H . . . 79.95 	66.88 

	

45.95, 51.50, 49.00 	34.95 
86.95 48.95 
82.95 44.95 

10.50 	5.88 
30 Percent Off 
20 Percent Off 

65c 	39c 

An unusual Christmas deco-
ration is in Hedwig Gast's 
room. It is a yucca plant in a 
shiny foil container with gum 
drops stuck on each limb. It is 
said to be very unusual and 
attractive. 

Many residents who spent 
either Christmas Eve or 
Christmas Day with their 
family and friends included 
Addie Jones, Lyra Holland, 
Bertha Kaltwasser, Thelma 
Price, Maud Wilson, Ruth 
Myers, Harold Mardis, Nora 
Edens, Dora Johnson, Alice 
Luikart, Flora Edwards, W.W. 
Vinyard, Bobby Hix and 
Nelson Hurst. 

turned off the TV and she 
missed her favorite program. 
Also, someone stole her glass-
es, she can't remember what 
she had for dinner, so it must 
not have been anything very 
great. 

You nod, pat her hand 
again, soothe her feelings and 
quietly leave. Then later you 
are loud and clear to the rest 
of the family about how 
terrible she is treated, and 
how you never see the purple 
sweater you gave her for 
Christmas and just maybe Afthe 
nurse's daughter has a hew 
sweater. 

If you had come and asked 
me I could explain that she is 
really in good health consider-
ing her age and arthritis. That 
she refused to go on the bus 
ride and sat in her chair in 
front of the TV and slept 
through Lawrence Welk. As 
for dinner today, we had beef 
stroganoff over noodles, car-
rots, cole slaw, and canta-
loupe. She ate everything on 
her tray. Her glasses are in 
her pocket, and she wears the 
purple sweater a lot. It must 
be washed occasionally and if 
she doesn't have it on it could 
be hanging in her closet. Did 
you look? 

Did you ever wonder who 
keeps her cothes clean, but-
tons sewn on: her hair 
shampooed and set; her false 
teeth brushed; her bed neat 
and clean; her dresser draw-
ers free from the seeds, 
peelings, and wrappings of 
goodies you bring her; keeps 
the rug clean where she spits 
and drips and waits on her as 
much as time or demand will 
allow? 

I Do! I love your mother as 
I do my own. I cry with her 
when you don't come in for 
days or weeks at a time. I 
listen to her reminisce of the 
past, laugh with her over 
funny memories, and hold her 
hand when she is depressed 
because "no one has time for 
an old lady." 

I am your subsitute for her 
family. 

But, maybe you are the 
exception and often come to 
see your mother. You seek me 
out to tell me how good she is 
looking and ask if there might 
be something she needs or 
that you could do for her. I 
bless you many times. Your 
words of appreciation are so 
encouraging. 

You know, I love my job. I 
am here by choice and not by 
chance. I really don't need you 
to get my satisfaction from 
my work. I receive that when 
I tuck your mother in at night 
and she gives me a kiss. Her 
smile is all I need. 

But, the next time you visit 
the Nursing Home where your 
loved one resides, look clos-
er.....see me. 

20.50 13.95 

	

14.75 	9.95 

	

15.75 	9.95 
25 Percent Off 

	

12.95 	7.88 

	

18.00 	9.88 
	6.59 	4.88 

299.88 169.95., 
299.95 199.95 
39.95 34.95 

52.00 46.88 

SALES! Sales are going on 
,everywhere this month, and 
they can really help smooth 
the rough seas of a tight 
budget. 

Watch this month for: white 
sales, storewide clearances, 
and furniture sales. It's im-
portant to understand why a 
price is reduced, and to know 
the difference between "Spe-
cial Purchase" and "Mark-
down." 

Either might be a good 
bargain, but the Special Pur-
chase is usually merchandise 
bought from the manufacturer 
at a low price for a special 
role. A markdown is a lowered 
price on merchandise that has 
been in stock in the store 
through the season. Mark- 

downs appear in storewide 
clearances. 

Check clothing markdowns 
carefully for flaws, missing 
buttons, belts, or stains - such 
as lipstick or make-up. (Make-
up can often be removed by 
washing or dry-cleaning.) 

Set a dollar goal for yourself 
when shopping sales, since 
wise buying means staying 
within your budget. 

Also, comparison-shop the 
"on sale" item with another 
not on sale. It may cost less at 
another store. 

I hope 1978 is a prosperous 
year for everyone in Parmer 
County. If my office can be of 
service to you, feel free to 
come by, or call 481-3619. 
Happy New Year! 

10 Harts Freestanding Screens 
1 Harts Freestanding Screen Ensemble 1272-3 	  

1 Harts Freestanding 972 	  
5 Fire Place Grates 36" 	  
4 Fire Place Grates 24" 	 
3 Coal Grate 21" 	  
Christian Fire Tools Shovel, Poker, Brush, Tong 	  
3 Christian Log Holder 270100 	  
3 Fire Place Lighter Pots 957 	  
3 Match Holder 19-160-0 

The Lutheran Youth League 
sang carols at the Center also. 

S.... 

Everyone misses Dennis 
Brooks and. Ann Humphreys 
who are both in Clovis 
Memorial Hospital. 

Nell Walling has donated 
two new parakeets to the 
Center. As yet they are 
nameless. Mrs. Copeland said 
that this is the next project. 

The Auxiliary will meet 
today (Friday) at 2:30 p.m. 
CST in the dining room. 

S.... 

(Editor's Note: The follow-
ing was submitted by Dora 
Nittler, Center administrator. 
The "letter to the family" was 
prepared by Dale Walker, 
administrator at the Silver 
Haven Care Center in Burle-
son, Tex., in an effort to show 
"the other side" of the story --
the staff that cares for 
patients in nursing homes.) 

FIREPLACE EQUIPMENT 
1 Malm Free Standing Fireplace (Slight Damage), .  fi4  

Franklin Fireplaces 6 ea 2 w-glass Doors 	  

Fireplace Heating System (Enclosed Firebird) 

Blower Attachment For Above ..A.A.,^04Orre 

Subscribe To 

THE TRIBUNE 
$6.30 Per Year 
in Parmer and 

Adjoining Counties 

SAVE $4.10 YEAR 
Over Single Copy Price 

,a010 

PLUMBING 

Stationery 
& Business 
Cards 

On A Diet? Don't 
Skip Breakfast 

If you are trying to shed 
those few extra pounds you 
picked up during the summer 
months, don't skip breakfast. 
Cut down on the total number 
of calories you have each day, 
but don't cut out breakfast. It 
has been about 12 hours since 
dinner and you need protein 
and carbohydrates at breakfast 
time to keep blood sugar at 
proper levels to avoid that mid-
morning slump. Eating break-
fast will also help keep you 
from getting hungry in the 
middle of the morning and in-
dulging in snack foods which 
may be high in calories but 
low in important nutrients you 
need. 

A nutritionally a d equate 
breakfast that can be easily 
adapted to fit the nutritional 
needs of all family members 
is juice, c e r e a l with milk, 
toast and milk to drink. 

The impression counts 
and successful business-
men lead with good look-
ing business cards and 
stationery. We suggest 
Coronet Stationery . 
you can feel the deep 
raised printing. Ask our 
representative to show 
you samples and sug-
gest layouts. 

THE STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

Dear Family: 
When I came in last night to 

see your mother, did you see 
me? 

I'm sure you knew someone 
was there to look after 
everyone, but did you really 
look to see who? Did you 
speak to me, or just nod and 
go straight to Grandma's 
room? Sometimes I don't even 
get that. 

You sit down, pat Grand-
mother's hand, straighten her 
shawl or lap robe, ask how she 
is and get a report on her 
activities. 

She might tell you she feels 
terrible, never gets to go 
anywhere, and someone 

4 Vanity Base & Top     164. 50 
3 Medicine Chest General Bathes  3034 3031 	  93.95 
3 Medicine Chest General Bath 300 301 	 493'9  .955  
3 Commode Seats General Bath RTH100 TTH120 fin-1130 	  29.95 
2 Vanity 20x17 General Bath PWM100 PfTM 101 	  60.50 
2 Vanity 25x19 General Bath MWM242 M0M243 	 84.95 
2 Vanity 20x17 General Bath MWM102 MEM103 	 60.50 

AUTOMOTIVE 	& TOOLS  Group Seven Air Filters 	 1.89 
5 Quaker Garage Shelf 	  16.95 
5 Pc. Screwdriver Set TT55 	 3.69 

10 Metric Tapeless Measure TV8 	 7.50 
10 XActo Handcrafter Set 	  19.95 
21 Auto Litter Basket Rubbermaid 	  1.59 
22 Auto Kool Cushion Rubbermaid 	 2.95 
27 Auto Snack Tray Rubbermaid 	  1.69 
10 1/4" Black & Decker Drill 7004 	  

6 3/8" Black & Decker Drill 7104 	 

2 
1 Dewalt 8" Radial Arm Saw 7400 

Dewalt 8" Radial Arm Saw 7700 	

 

2 Black & Decker Angle Grinder ac-dc 4245 	  
PAINT & SUNDRIES 

Formby's Lemon Oil 8 oz 	  1.99 
Formby's Furniture Refinish 32 oz 	 9.99 
Formby's Paint Remover Wash 32 oz 	 2.49 
Formby's Special Steel Wool 4 pk 	 99c 

44 GE White Bath & Tub Caulk 	 4.99 
ELECTRICAL 	  12 Romex 12-3 W-G NM 50 ft 	 11.29 

99.95 
59.95 
29.95 
16.95 
36.95 
54.95 
36.95 

1.29 
6.88 
2.88 
3.66 
9.95 
98c 

1.99 
99c 

12.98 	8.99 
13.99 	9.99 
179.95 139.95 
159.95 124.95 
99.95 79.95 

99c 
5.98 
1.66 
59c 

2.29 

5.88 

3.99 
2.19 

13c ft 
12c ft 
14c ft 

29.95 18.88 
30 Percent Off 

18 Romex 14-3 W-G NM 50 ft 	  7,95 
31 Romex 14-3 W-G NM 25 ft 	 4.29 
14 Romex 12-3 w.G NM 250 ft sRc:(1,:Cu,11.„ 	  27c ft 

5 Underground Feeder 12-3 UF Plain 	 23c ft 
4 Underground Feeder 12-3 W-G UF 250 ft  	28c ft 

11 GE Home Sentry Smoke Alarm 8202-001 	  
Selected Group Of Light Fixtures 	  

MF SPECIAL 

PROGRAM PRICES! 

New Equip. 
MF 1105 Tractor with Cab, 

Air, Duals 
MF 1135 Tractor with Cab, 

Air, Duals 
760-750-510 Combines 

Used Equip. 
1972 IH 1466 Tractor, Cab, 

Air, Duals 
1972 MF 1150, Major Over-

haul, Cab, Duals 
1975 MF 760 Combine, 

Cab, Air, 30.5x32 Tires 
1972 JD 7700 Combine, 24 

ft. Head, Corn Heads 
1967 MF 410 Gas, w/cab 
1967 MF 410 Dsl., w/cab 
4 Btm. JD Breaking Plow, 

vapackers 

CLOVIS FARM 

CENTER INC. 
Hi-Way 18 North 

Ph. 762-3726 

Texico-Farwell 
Lions 

Meets 2nd and 
Mondays 

CLARA'S SPUR 
RESTAURANT 

Club 
Ith 

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

"When Understanding Is Needed Most" 

Prince & Manana-Clovis-Ph. 763-5541 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

The Farwell Independent School District will 
offer for sale by sealed bids the following 
property: 

Lots 10, 11, 12, 13, and 14, Block 3, Lan-
ford and Nutt Addition to the town of 

Farwell. 

Bids should be received in the office of the 
Superintendent by 5 p.m. on January 9, 1978. 

Bids will be opened at the regular meeting of 
the School Board on January 9, 1978, at 8:30 
p.m. 

Bids should be addressed to the Board of 
Trustees, Farwell independent School District, 
Box F, Farwell, Texas 79325. 

The Board reserves the right to reject any or 

all bids. 

W. M. Roberts, 
Superintendent 

ALL MERCHANDISE 
SOLD AS IS. NO 

RETURNS OR REFUNDS. 
MERCHANDISE WILL 
NOT BE HELD FOR 

LATER PICKUP 
WITHOUT PAYMENT. 

4 4  

:$1 

S. -A 

a 
• 

0 

t 

MARC/WARE STORE 

master charge 

a 

Of, 
j• r 

JI 

0 at 
4 4 61  
.21 
• 'II 



MR. AND MRS. M1TZ WALLING 

NEllg DON 

COMET PRINT 
sends flashes of 

color across a 
field of black or 

navy. An all-
occasion dress 

eased with a sash, 
of soft, washable 

polyester, 10-20 
sizes. 

7r  THE FASHION SHOP 
420 Main 

The Fashion Corner Of Clovis 

, • • • • • • • % %. 	%.%.% 	% % % 

• \ N, .4, .4. 4, 	\ 	N. N. N. %, N. N.. N. N. N. N, N. N. N. N. 1. N. N. 14 14 '1 14 N. N. N. ,N N. N. 1, 1, Nk 1, 14 '4 

1520 MITCHELL 
For longer Lasting Flowers 

I

MADCWS 
flowerland, inc. 

1520 MITCHELL - 763-3465 
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Holiday Visits And Visitors 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Felts 

IIOf Lariat spent the Christmas 

4 *holiday weekend in Santa Fe 

1 

 ‘with their son and family, Mr. 
• and Mrs. Charles Lee Felts 

and children. Also joining the 
*group were their other son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 

id 
 

(Felts and children. 

I . ..... 

Wedding 

Reminder 

Orie Joneses Celebrate 

25th Anniversary 

Approximately 30 relatives 
and friends attended the 
reception. 

Gene Sheetses 

Mr. and Mrs. One Jones of 
Farwell celebrated their 25th 
wedding anniversary Decem-
ber 17 with a reception in their 
home. The occasion was 
hosted by the couple's chil-
dren, Connie Wagley of For-
est, N.M.; Tim Jones of 
Farwell, and Brenda and 
Steve of the home. They were 
assisted by an aunt, Marie 
Farmer of Clovis. 

The serving table was cov-
ered with a white cloth and 
centered with a bouquet of 
blue carnations and white 
daisies. The white cake was 
heart-shaped and the words 
"25th Anniversary" were writ-
ten in blue icing. 

Parents Of Son 

ness. The local family re-
turned home December 28. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Hall, 
Bobbi and Ken-i of Farwell 
spent Christmas Day visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Robbins of 
Earth. 

.5.44 

Mr. and Mrs. G.A. White-
sides, Guy, Ruth and Elva of 
Farwell visited Whitesides's 
brother and family, Dr. and 
Mrs. Francis Whitesides and 
Patsy of Borger, for Christ-
mas. 

Friends and relatives of Don 
Cherry and Kathi Jolly are 
reminded of the couple's wed-
ding Friday, Jan. 6, at 6 p.m. 
MST in Kingswood United 
Methodist Church, Clovis. 

Parents of the bride-elect 
are Mr. and Mrs. Al Jolly of 
Clovis. The prospective bride-
groom is the son of Mrs. 
Danalee Cherry of Texico and 
the late Wayne Cherry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Alana of 
Farwell visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Sifford, in 
Lubbock for several days. 

Caulking Saves 
Energy, Money 

Marriage 
Licenses 

Mr. and Mrs. James Mc-
Dorman of Farwell traveled 
by plane to Ashland, Ohio, 
where they visited a son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
McDorman, Mamie, Tracey, 
and Ira James for the 
holidays. They left December 
19 and returned home Decem-
ber 29. 

..see 

"Caulk it," and chalk it 
up to money saved, but 
before buying caulking 
compounds, locate air-leak 
areas, advises Glenda 
Moore, housing and home 
furnishings specialist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex-
tension Service, The Texas 
ABM University System. 

Parmer County Clerk's of-
fice has issued four marriage 
licenses since the last report. 
Those receiving the licenses 
were Jose Hernandez Alanis 
and Evangelina Hernandez; 
Lee King Howard, Jr. and 
Sandra Gay Watkins; Richard 
Malcolm Son and Dorothy 
Ruth Johnston; Charles Ed-
ward Burchett and Rolanda 
Dee Hudson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Sheets of 
Abilene are parents of their 
first child, a son, born 

• Tuesday, Jan. 3, at an Abilene 
hospital. 

The new arrival has been 
II*  ' named Brandon Scott. He 

weighed six pounds at birth. ,l. 
Maternal grandparents are 

' ' Mr. and Mrs. Bill Roberts of 
Farwell. Paternal grandpar-

' I ae  ents are Harry Sheets of 
Farwell and Alta Sheets of 

- Clovis. 
I * Great-grandparents are Mrs. 
i 1  ‘9Virginia Sheets and Mr. and 
) Mrs. W.E. Martin, all of 

11 
 Farwell, and Mr. and Mrs. 
• Homer Whitlow of Kress. 

Mitz fallings Feted 

On 35th Anniversary 
"No knowledge is so easily 
found as when it is needed." 

Robert Henri 

Sealing cracks around 
doors and windows can 
reduce cool air losses from 
15 to 37 per cent, which 
saves money and cooling 
time, she says. 

joints between siding and 
windowsills. Also between 
eaves and moldings, chim-
ney (lashings and the roof 
— as well as between vent 
pipes, water faucets, wire 
connections and siding, the 
specialist says. 

Also check areas where 
concrete or masonry por-
ches or steps join the main 
structure, and all corners 
formed by siding. 

In addition, inspect exist-
ing caulking. Plan to 
replace dried out or 
cracked caulking. Kevin Halls 

Have Daughter "Caulking will cut down 
cold air losses and keep 
out dirt, dust, noise and 
moisture. It is a tedious 
job, but most homeowners 
can do it themselves." 

Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Hall of 
Lazbuddie are the parents of 
their first child, a girl, born 
December 26 at 4:59 p.m. in 
the West Plains Medical 
Center in Muleshoe. The new 
arrival, who has been named 
Brandy Lann, weighed seven 
pounds, two ounces and was 19 
and 1/2  inches long at birth. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Max Crim of 
Lazbuddie and Mr. and Mrs. 

• Kenneth Hall of Friona are the 
paternal grandparents. Mater-

; , nal great-grandparents are 
Mrs. Gladys Ritchey of Ama- 
rillo and Mrs. J.W. Crim of 
Muleshoe. Paternal great-
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. L.R. Hall of Muleshoe 
and Mrs. Dana Arnold of 
Needmore, Tex. 

Critical exterior areas of 
house, mobile home or 
apartments that require 
sealing periodically are 
window frames and sashes, 
door frames, chimneys and 

24, 1942, in Clovis. At the time 
of their marriage, Walling was 
stationed with the United 
States Air Force in Wichita 
Falls, Tex. 

The couple moved back to 
Farwell in January of 1946 to 
make their home in the area 
where Mitz was born and 
reared. He continued farming 
and is still engaged in that 
occupation. Nell was born in 
Hill County, Tex., but moved 
with her family to Forrest, 
N.M., in 1929. 

On Christmas Eve after-
noon, Mitz and Nell Walling of 
Farwell were honored with a 
special come and go party at 
their home in honor of their 
35th wedding anniversary. 

Over 100 guests registered 
and were served refreshments 
during the receiving hours. A 
Christmas motif was featured 
throughout the Walling home 
and in the table decor. 

Hosting the affair were the 
couple's children, Henry and 
Edith Ann Campbell, Jeffrey, 
Mitzi and Corey of Clovis, and 
Milton Lee and Robin Walling 
of Farwell. 

Mitz Walling and Arena Nell 
Gunn were married December 

• 

Variety Club 

To Disband 

Girl Born To 

James Uriostes 
vp 

• 

• 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Urioste 
of Albuquerque, N.M., an-
nounce the birth of their 
second child, a girl, born 
December 19 at Presbyterian 
Hospital. The new arrival, who 

a has been named Marissa Cari, 
11 

	

	weighed seven pounds and was 
19 inches long at birth. She 
has one sister named Anna 

• Lissa who is seven years old. 
Maternal grandparents are 

Mr. and Mrs. Merced Rojas of 
• Texico and paternal grand-

k parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
James Urioste of Hayward, 
Calif. 

Mrs. Urioste is the former 
Margot Rojas of Texico. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Hamp-
ton and sons Wayne and 
Douglas of Raleigh, N.C., were 
guests of Mrs. Hampton's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Edd 
Autrey, in Texico over the 
Christmas holidays. 

Also visiting in the Autrey 
home during the holidays were 
their son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Autrey and new 
daughter Tosha Renee of 
Clovis; 

Other visitors were Mr. and 
Mrs. Les Lambert of Mule-
shoe, Mr. and Mrs. Clovis 
DeBord and Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Walker, all of Lubbock; 
Royce DeBord of Houston, 
Linda and Donna Lambert of 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Edd 
Stephenson of Portales, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Autrey 
and Everett Autrey of San 
Jon, N.M. 

sees. 

Holiday visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. J.V. Stancell 
of West Camp were their 
children and grandchildren, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jackie Stancell, 
Bobby, Jill and Jan of Allen, 
Tex.; Mr. and Mrs. Bennie 
Stancell, Steven, Carey and 
Kyle of West Camp; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Taylor, Kevin 
and Kimberly of St. Louis, Mo. 
The Taylors spent one week 
visiting the Stancells. 

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gil Patschke for the 
Christmas holidays were their 
daughters and husbands, Mr. 
and Mrs. Rex McCloy of 
Stinnett and Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Blair of Montrose, Colo. 
While at home the McCloys 
attended her 1972 Farwell 
Class Reunion. 

....• 

Visiting the Doyle Greens 
for the holidays were their 
sons, Darwin Green of Mont-
gomery, Ala., and Gary 
Green, a student at West 
Texas State University. 

Guests of Mrs. Alvenia Cox 
during the holidays were her 
daughter, Billie Phillips of 
Lubbock, and her grandchil-
dren and families, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Irby, Jerilyn and 
Jennifer of Alamogordo, N.M., 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Fiola, Jori 
and Jinger of Canyon; Al 
Phillips of Coahoma, Tex., and 
Ty Phillips of LubboclIgit 

•55.• - 

Mr. and Mrs. W.H. Williams 
and son William of Freehold, 
N.J., arrived here December 
20 for a pre-holiday visit with 
her sister and family, the Ted 
Magnesses. On December 22 
the Magness and Williams 
families traveled to Walnut 
Springs, Tex., to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. L.B. Hensley, parents of 
Mrs. Williams and Mrs. Mag- 

Oklahoma Lane Variety Club 
met last month in the home of 
Mrs. W.N. Foster of Farwell 
for its annual Christmas party 
and gift exchange. During the 
business session, club mem-
bers voted to disband the 
organization. 

Refreshments were served 
to Dexter Watkins, Carrie 
Foster, Garner Briscoe, Janie 
Sides, Pearl Grissom and Lola 
Grissom. 

The Eugene Lonsdales of 
Farwell visited his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. W.H. Lonsdale, 
in Henrietta, Okla., for several 
days. They arrived there 
December 23 and returned 
home December 28. 

Visiting Mrs. Lillie Hughes 
of Farwell for the holidays 
were her children and fami-
lies, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Freiling, Russ, Rynn, Amy 
and Reagan of San Antonio, 
Dudley Hughes, Kevin and 
Lokeene of Bovina, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Hughes, Tim and 
Andy of Farwell. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Getz of 
Farwell returned home Janu-
ary 1 from a holiday visit with 
their son and family, Dr. and 
Mrs. Michael Getz and sons 
John Bryan and Mark Jerrod, 
in Rochester, Minn. The Getz-
es left Farwell December 22. 

For the first time in eight 
years, all members of the 
Garlan Edge family in Texico 
gathered together for the 
Christmas holiday. The visi-
tors included Mr. and Mrs. 
Odell Edge, Tammy, Betty 
and Jimmy of Tucumcari; Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Harrison, 
Sandy, Pam and Tonya of 
Broadview; Randy and Tresha 
Pierce of Tucumcari; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Reynolds, 
Paul, Deana, Deget and Jef-
frey of Hot Springs, Ark. 

They were joined by Corine 
and Lynda Pierce, Wilma and 
Darryle Edge and Dick Riley, 
all of Texico, and Dwayne 
Miller of Farwell. 

I 
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FOR ALL 
YOUR NEW 
& USED 
CAR, TRUCK 
& PICK UP 
NEEDS 

'DOC' STEWART INC. 
2400 MABRY DR.  

We Are Happy 
To Announce 

The Grand Opening 
Of 

HORN - CLAYTON 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

103 Third St • 
Farwell 

Your Complete Independent 
Insurance Agent, Servicing 
Farwell, Texico, Lariat And 
Surrounding Areas. 

LIFE - HEALTH - AUTO - HOME 

Come By To See Us For All Your Insurance Needs - - 

KEN HORN 	MINA HORN 	DICKIE CLAYTON 

BOX 796 
	

PH. 481-9246 	 FARWELL 



BOYD'S 
BRAKE 

AND 
ALIGNMENT 

1605 MABRY DR. 
7634326 

MONROESHOCKS 
MAX AIR ADJUSTABLE 

SHOCKS 

BRAKE SHOES 
EXCHANGE 	• 

DRUM TURNING 

ALL WORK 
GUARANTEED_ 

J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY,INC. 
Box 627 

Farwell, Texas 
Ph. 481-3288 

New Location - 109 Fifth Street 

OFFICE HOURS 
Monday - Friday, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturday, by appointment 

* HAVE BUYERS - NEED FARM LISTINGS * 

SPECIALS OF THE WEEK 

160 A. irrigated, 2 wells, lays nearly perfect on 
highway near Progress. Nice 3-bedroom house. 

ma. 

South of Farwell: 520 A. irrigated, 3 circles, 2 
with hay, good water area. 4 wells. 

••••• 
320 A. irrigated, 3 miles south of Friona on 
highway. Tailwater return system. Lays nearly 
perfect. 

SIII•114 

257 A. irrigated, 1 well. Lays real good. Very nice 
4-bedroom house near highway. Good water area. 

Super nice 
mobile ho 
Beautifully 

bath Solitaire 
age areas. 

3- roo 
xtra 

r 

720 A., 7 wells, good water, lays good, Friona 
area. 

SAWA* 

Very neat 2 bedroom, 2 bath house. 

160 A. it 	e 	0 	ti 	d Water area. 
Priced rig 

160 A. irrigated. One 8-inch well. Good water. 
Oklahoma Lane area. 

3 bedroom, 2 bath, stucco house, fenced back 
yard, garage. storage building, basement, good 
location in Farwell. 

••••• 

Lays nearlyZriect,‘ 160 	irrigated, 2-8 inch 
wells, 29% d 

••••• 

160 A. irrigated, two miles north of Muleshoe on 
highway. 

1411,11.• 

160 A. irrigatSnralepty perfect. I well, 
beautiful brick 	 tagtway. 

80 A. irrigate 
area. 

narl 	effect, West Camp 

1.11411.1 

A unique 2-story, 5 bedroom. 2-bath home with 
carport. With small house in back. 

Lovely 3-bedroom, 1 1/2  bath home, double garage, 
low maintenance yard with sprinkler system. 
Excellent location. Lots of goodies. 

2 bedroom. 1 bath stucco house with garage. Nice 
yard. Very good location in Farwell. 

••••• 

160 A. complete with one well and galvanized 
electric sprinkler, priced to sell, Farwell area. 

••••• 

New 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick homes for sale. 

On farm living, extra nice 3 bedroom brick, 1 and 
,A2 bath, with 40 X 80 quonset barn on 3 A. 

160 A. irrigated. fully tiled, lays real good. Good 
water area, priced right. 

3 bedroom, 13/4  bath, double garage, brick home 
in nice neighborhood. 

SAVING IS GREAT 
INVEST IN ItEik ESTATE 

"Sales and Lians Are Our Service" 

11111 ,11** 

Instrument report ending 
December 28, 1977 in County 
Clerk office Bonnie Warren, 
County Clerk. 

Deed - Veterans Land Board 
- Billy Glyn Loafman - 35.01 
out SW/pt Sec. 19 T4S; R4E. 

WD - Billie Francis Long 
Homer - Bob L. Finley - lots 
11 & 12, Blk. 39, Friona. 

WD - Joe Boeckman - Santos 
Rando, Jr. - lot 4, Blk. 79, 
Friona. 

WD - Joel Nowlin - Manuel 
G. Ortiz - S 10 ft. lot 12, all 
lots 13 & 14, Blk. 20, Farwell. 

WD - Frio Development Co. 
Inc. - Jon M. Roden - E 50' lot 
8 & W 50' lot 7 Blk. 3, Western 
Add. Friona. 

Tire Co. of Farwell 

LEE'S ELECTRIC 
1  Ph. 481 -3380 	 Farwell ! 

me 
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I X N  COURTHOUSE NOTES -/I N . 
ft. lot 8 Blk. 3, Western Add. 
Friona. 

WD - Robert Hollis - Hazel 
Guinn Stowers - lot 13, Blk. 61, 
Friona. 

WD - A.W. Anthony, Jr. -
Dennis Wayne Anthony - und. 
7.57% int. pt. S1,2 Sec. 36, T2N; 
R3E. 

WD - A.W. Anthony, Jr. -
Linda Darlene Anthony - und. 
9.375% int. in SEk., Sec. 26 & 
SW1, 4 Sec. 25, T2N; R3E. 

WD - A.W. Anthony, Jr. -
Larry Eugene Anthony - undv. 
8.333% int. W1.2 Sec. 26, T2N; 
R3E. 

• 

Instrument report ending 
December 21, 1977 in County 
Clerk office Bonnie Warren, 
County Clerk. 

WD - Clifton M. Henderson -
Johnnie Floyd Morris - lots 19 
& 20, Blk. 20, Farwell. 

WD - Jimmie Heard - Leo 
Mathis - NW' Sec. 16, TlOS: 
R2E. 

WD - J.E. Sikes - Jerry 
McClaran - SE,4 & NW1 4 Sec. 
2, TlOS; R2E. 

WD - J.C. Redwine - H. 
Arnold Dailey - SWY4 Sec. 25, 
T3S; R3E. 

WD - Stephan Grundy - John 
David Grimsley - lot 9 & W 25 

REDUCE safe & fast with 
GoBese Tablets & E-Vap 
"water pills." Rose Drug. 

10-8tp 

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
junk cars and tractors. Far-
well Pipe and Iron, 601 Avenue 
A, Farwell. Phone 481-3287. 

28-tine 

ATTENTION 
CATTLEMEN 

ROOT CONTROL — Have 
machine for clearing sewers. 
Also all types plumbing work. 
Doyle Goldsmith. Ph. 481-3457 
or 482-3279. 	 8-tfnc 

in the EXTRA NICE - 3-2-2, den, 
fenced, corner lot on highway 
with country atmosphere. 101 
Manana. 	 17-2tp. 

i We offer a complete line 

of beautiful TEXICO-FARWELL AREA: 

TAKE UP DEBTS on three 
bedroom, fully carpeted, two 
bath brick home. Excellent 
location. Shown by appoint-
ment only. Call Joyce Sikes 
481-3321 or 481-9271. 	14-tfnc 

Your local 
,used Cow 
dealer is 

friona bi-products 
Seven days a week 

stock removal 

CALL COLLECT 247-3032 

CARD OF THANKS 

Thank you for the flowers, 
cards, telephone calls, and 
concern expressed for Uvon 
during his stay in the hospital. 

Uvon and Faye Ford 

	Ammimmussionmi 
Fcvituett am& Ob Ckniof 

Leonard Harper - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

WANT ADS PH. 481-3681 
CLASSIFIED & LEGAL RATES: 

First insertion, per word - 10c 
Second and additional insertions - 8c 
Minimum charge - $1.25 on cash order, $1.50 on account 
Card of Thanks - Same as classified word rate 

Double rate for blind ads 
Classified Display - $1.50 per col. inch 

MINIMUM BILLING CHARGE $3.00 

Classified Insertion Deadline For 
Friday's State Line Tribune - 10 a.m. Wednesday 

WIN THE BIBLE 
IT CORNELIUS R. STAM PRES. 

BEHAN BIBLE SOCIETY 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60633 

Texia 

Finat Saptiot Mack 
Joel Horne - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

TWO MINUTES 

r 
o# 

• 

• 

• 

ALWAYS ABOUNDING 
Fatweit 

Fiita Baptiat Ckwtck 
Dudley Bristow - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Subanibt Ta 

THE TRIBUNE 

$6.30 Pen gem 

tg Polon agd 

Acljaixiitg Catudie6 

SAVE $4.10 YEAR 
Om Six* Copy Ptite 

Drop In And 

See The New 

AC Gleaner 

F2 Combine 

3.3 Liter Dsl. 

W/20 Ft. Head 

A PLAINS 
EQUIPMENT 

1130 Wallace - Clovis 

 

/Ile NEW EQUIPMENT 

Noble spring tooth harrows 
27 ft. - $1985.00 
33 ft. - 2595.00 
36 ft. - 2725.00 
39 ft. - 3050.00 

SALE PRICE 
GOOD THRU 

JAN. 14th 
12 NOON, 1978 

11111111•A 

1 - 9 Shank Deep Ripper 
Plow $1050.00 

1 - 20 ft. Kawanee Clod 
Buster $5250.00 
- Walden "CS" H.D. 

Double Implement Hitch 
[2-21 ft.) $1595.00 

1 - RamSower Hitch With 
Gauge Wheels 1-21 4 & 
1-4x4 Bar $850.00 

USED EQUIPMENT 

2 - 21 ft. J.D. Tandam 
Disc Each $950.00 

1 - 14 ft. Krause Disc 

WOOLEY-HURST INC. 

MULESHOE 

Your IH Dealer 

Am** 06 Geri 
J.M. Hutson - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:15 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Woship - 6:30 p.m. 

ten work the hardest. Sometimes 
our bodies suffer for it, but we do 
not immediately give up. 

And how much more urgent is 
the work of the Lord! Souls are 
perishing all about us for whom 
Christ died. It is our plain duty to 
pray for them and tell them of His 
love. It is our responsibility to toil 
and sacrifice that they may hear 
and believe the good news. What 

shall we say when some day we 

stand before our Savior if we have 

been satisfied merely to know Him 

ourselves? And what will He say? 

Let us then be up and going, "al-
ways abounding in the work of the 

Lord," Life is too short to fritter 

away the precious moments God has 

given us to proclaim His saving 

grace. Let us tell them, then, by lip 

and by life, by our testimony and 

by our behavior, that "Christ JesUs 

came into the world to save sinners" 

and that "we have redemption 

through His blood, the forgiveness 

of sins according to the riches of His 

grace" (Eph. 1 : 7 ). 

Si. 9t4eplea 
Cailt6fic Ckwtck 

Chrvsostom Partee - Priest 
Confession - Sunday, 9:30 a.m. 
Sunday Mass - 10 a.m. 
Christian Doctrine after Mass 

"Therefore, my beloved brethren, 
be ye steadfast, unmoveable, always 
abounding in the work of the Lord, 
forasmuch as ye know that your 
labor is not in vain in the Lord" 
(I Cor. 15:58). 

We should note carefully that 
the Apostle Paul here addresses only 
his brethren in Christ, those who 
have truly been born again — born 
into the family of God. 

Furthermore, he sent this appeal 

to Christians everywhere: to "all 

that in every place call upon the 

name of Jesus Christ our Lord" 

(I Cor. 1:2). He knew that there is 
a tendency among all believers to be 

tempted to abandon the work of 

the Lord through discouragement 

or carelessness, so he pleads with us 

to be "steadfast" and "unmove-

able," reminding us that our labor 

is "not in vain in the Lord." 

How we need this exhortation! 

We do not soon abandon our busi-

nesses or homes. We toil on in spite 

of difficulties and obstacles, and 

when the outlook is darkest we of- 

NEW EQUIPMENT 
2 - 2 - 155 White, Cab, Air, 

Duals, Weights. 18 Speed 
Trans., Q.H. Radio 

White 4-150-4WD Cab, Air, 
Radio, QH, Hydraul 
Shift, Loaded 

White 2-135 Cab, Air, 
Duals, QH, 18 speed Hy- 
draul. 

Versatile 850, 280 H.P., 
20.8 x 38 Duals, Air, 
Radio, Loaded. 

White 5 bottom spinner 
plows 

Ferguson Tilrovators 
King Offsets - 14', 16', 

21' - 24' Blades 

Hamby Chisel Plow - 6 
Row 

L.B.I. Drag Bars 
Caldwell 1000 RPM Shred-

ders 

USED EQUIPMENT 
Caldwell 4 Row Shredders 

14' Shaeffer offset 26" 
blades [excellent condi- 
tion) 

1972 MF 1150 Tractor 

14' MM Tandam 

MM 800 HD's 
MM 800's 
MM 605's 

FARWELL 

EQUIPMENT CO. 
Ph. 481-3212 

Farwell, Tr. 

A 

Kew figla 13aptiet Ckuteit 
Thomas J. Spikes - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Services - 6:30 p.m. 

Catuay Baptitt Ckwtck 
Carrell Watkins - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

• . 

Ultited Pegfee66tai Ckwtek 
B. Schwarz - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:30 p.m. 

CAPITOL FOODS 
FARWELL 

INSURANCE 
AGENCY, INC. 
AUTO-FIRE-CASUALTY 
509 Ave. A - Ph. 481-3361 

Olttaltrima Lute 

Ckwtck 
Harvey Whittenburg - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

A PLAINS 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

Sales - Service 
769-1936 

1130 Wallace, Clovis 

TEXICO 
FINA 

gaiko evuunic.4 

2„ia 664 

621 Anderson 
Texico, N.M. 

[6 blocks north of bank) 

SHEREY-ANDERSON-PITMAN, 

INC. Olitaltuta Lame 

Baptist Ckwtck 
Moody Smith - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

312 WHEELER 
Ph. 482-9915 

P. 0. BOX 126 
FARWELL, TEXAS 79325 

The 
CITIZENS BANK 

FARWELL FINA 

Ph. 481-9917 

Carrell Watkins 
WORLEY MILLS INC Weat Camp 

13aptibt 
Lewis Johnson - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

Texico Branch 
Complete Bank Service 

Member FDIC 

Religious Music All 
Day Sunday On 

KZOL 
TEXACO 

INC. 

Woodrow Lovelace 1570 On Your Dial 

Si 961(1(16 
.CuStatut 

Herman J. Schelter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 11111111111 IMO MI EMI 	IRMI INN MB NM MINI NM MI En =I MI MEI 

I 
WATTS 

Machine and Pump 
INSULATE 

NOW! 
' 	Save On Your Fuel Bills 
1 

Prescriptions a Specialty 
481-3281 

Layne Bowler Pumps and 
Repair - Gearhead Repair 
Ph. 481-3239 - Farwell, Tx. 

CECIL'S 

SERVICE 
Ph. 481-9931 

ROSE DRUG .  

& GIFT SHOP 

La tiat 

Ckwtck 06 Clotiet 
L.L. Ginning - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - H. a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

Hastiiit iftematiat 

Igeikadiat Ckwtck 
Tempte 13aptia Ckwielt 
HiWay 84 & 9th St. 
Paul Spears — Pastor 
Sunday School — 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship — 11 a.m. 
Sunday Evening — 6:30 p.m. 

Russell Martin - Pastor 
Church School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 

,Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Ptea6a4d Nat 

13aptitt Ckatit 
Rick Parker - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 



ERNIE PARO 
Manager 

HOME PHONE 
762.0757 

WALCO INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
"serving the animal industry" 

CLOVIS DIVISION 
501 S. HULL 

CLOVIS. NEW MEXICO 80101 

OFFICE PHONE P. 0 BOX 459 
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 505 • 762.0731 

RECYCLING 

RANC 
and FE 0 

RS, FARMERS 
T OPERATORS 
MUNITY SERVICE 

We Provide . . 

Complete nitary Service 
on 

63-5513 

T 

FOR FR 

Call Collect 

CLOVIS, NEW MEX 763-5513 
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4 	 Presley and wife, Beaulah 

Presley, Fred Porter, George 
W. Bell and wife, Lou Bell, 
George Eads, individually and 
as Trustee for Texas State 
Bank of Farwell, Texas, a 
defunct corporation whose of-
ficers and directors are un-
known, all of whose places of 
residence are unknown, the 
unknown husband or husbands 
and unknown wife or wives of 
each of the above named 
parties! all of whose names 
and places of residence are 
unknown, and if any of the 
above named parties are de-
ceased, then their unknown 
heirs, assigns, devisees and 
legal representatives, all of 
whom are unknown, and all of 
whose names and places of 
residence are unknown, and 
all unknown claimants, whose 
names and places of residence 
are unknown, are Defendants. 

Farwell Yearlings 

Lose To Bovina 

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as fol-
lows, to-wit: 

Keevin 

Farwell seventh and eighth 
grade Yearlings battled Bo-
vina December 19 each losing 
to their opponents, 39-13 and 
35-17, respectively. 

For the 7th Yearlings, Frank 
Cantu made 7 points followed 
by Jay Anderson and Rene 
Reyes with 2 each. 

For the 8th Yearlings, Wa-
verly Coates pumped in 7 
points. Also scoring were 
Blake Buchenau with 5, David 
Daniel, 4; and Brent Green, 1. 

S.... 

The 8th Yearlings and 8th 
Steerettes were to compete in 
the Bovina Junior High Tour-
nament Thursday through Sat-
urday. First game for the girls 
was to be at 3 p.m. and the 
initial contest for the boys was 
to begin at 4:15 p.m. 

Farwell Junior High teams 
will meet Hart Monday, Jan. 
9. 

Farwell Steers Rowdy Chandler, Russ Jones and 
Kelley, left to right, were named to the All-Tournament team 
at the Muleshoe Basketball Tournament held last week. The 
boys in Blue and White also captured first place honors, 
defeating Floydada, Muleshoe and Abernathy. 

Plaintiffs bring this suit in 
trespass to try title alleging 
that they are the owners in 
fee simple of the following 
described lands, to-wit: 

All-Tournament 

Steers 

In 1874, Pierre Janssen 
a French pioneer of solar 
physics and of photography, 
made the first film record-
ing of the transit of Venus 
across the sun. 

All of Lots 19 and 20 of 
Block 20, of the Original 
Town of Farwell, Parmer 
County, Texas, as shown by 
plat of said town of record 
in Vol. 2, Page 499, et. seq. 
of the Deed Records of 
Parmer County, Texas. 

CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

Alleging further that on or 
about December 1, 1977, De-
fendants each unlawfully en-
tered upon said land and 
ejected Plaintiffs therefrom 
and unlawfully withhold pos-
session from said Plaintiffs, 
and Plaintiffs further pray for 
judgment for title to and pos-
session of said real property, 
for a writ of possession and 
further plead and claim title 
to said real property by virtue 
of the 5-year and 10-year 
statutes of limitation of the 
State of Texas. 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved, 

The officer executing this 
process shall promptly execute 
the same according to law, 
and make due return as the 
law directs. 

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said 
Court, at office in Farwell, 
Texas, this the 19th day of 
December, A.D. 1977. 

CLASSIFIED RATES 

Steers Take 
Farwell Steers placed first in the Muleshoe Invit'ational Tournament held Dec. 29-31. 
Pietttred are, left to right, front row: Vick Christian, Rowdy Chandler, Keevin Kelley and 
Robin Roberts; back row: Radney Robertson, Kayle Watts, Coach Bert Roanhaus, Clay 
Roberts and Russ Jones. 

First 

(SEAL) 

Pi Three Named All-Tournament - 
• 

ATTEST: Dorothy Quickel 
Clerk 

District Court, Parmer 
County, Texas 

By Dorothy Lovelace-Deputy 

• • 

• 

I " 

• 

Farwell Steers Garner First 
In Muleshoe Invitational 

First Insertion, per word - 10c 

Second and Additional Insertions - 8c 

Minimum charge paid in advance - $1.25 

Minimum charge if billed - $1.50 

Double Rate For Blind Ads 

Card of Thanks • Same As Classified 

Classified Display - $1.50 per col. inch 

Issued this 19th day of 
December, A.D. 1977. 

Dorothy Quickel Clerk 
By Dorothy Lovelace-Deputy 

their mettle in the tournament 
as they bested each opponent 
by 10 or more points. 

Filed this 19th day of Decem-
ber, 1977. 

Dorothy Quickel Clerk 
District Court, Parmer 

County, Texas 
By Dorothy Lovelace-Deputy 

Published in State Line Trib-
une Dec. 23, 30, 1977, Jan. 6, 
13, 1978. 

Victories have been coming 
the Steers' way as they also 
routed Plains December 20, 

64-59. Jones hit for 24 points 
while Chandler and Watts 
each pumped in 10, followed 
by C. Roberts with 8; Tim 
Ellison, 6; Kelley, 4; and 
Christian, 2. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 

BiltIr SELL 
RE RENT 

In compliance with the 
statutes, rules and regulations 
of the Public Utility Commis-
sion off' Texas, Mountain Bell 
hereby issues notice of its 
intent . to add the applicable 
local gross receipts taxes to 
the local telephone service 
charges for customers in 
Farwell, Texas effective Jan-
uary 19, 1978. 

This proposal will add about 
three percent to the intra-state 
revenues which Mountain Bell 
derives from its services in 
the Farwell area. 

A copy of Mountain Bell's 
proposal has been filed with 
the Public Utility Commission 
in Austin. It is also available 
for inspection in Mountain 
Bell's offices at 500 Texas 
Avenue, El Paso, Texas. 

USE A TRIBUNE 
WANT AD 

TO: E.J. Johnson and wife, 
Maye Johnson, Mike Britting 
and wife, Annie Britting, M. 
Britting and wife, Annie Brit-
ting, Anna Britting, Anma 
Britting, Della Porter, Ella 
Porter, C.P. Wirth, C.M. 
Presley and wife, Beaulah 
Presley, Fred Porter, George 
W. Bell and wife, Lou Bell, 
George Eads, individually and 
as Trustee for Texas State 
Bank of Farwell, Texas, a 
defunct corporation whose of- 
ficers and directors are un-
known, all of whose places of 
residence are unknown, the 
unknown husband or husbands 
and unknown wife or wives of 
each of the above named 
parties, all of whose names 
and places of residence are 
unknown, and if any of the 
above named parties are de-
ceased, then their unknown 
heirs, assigns, devisees and 
legal representatives, all of 
whom are unknown, and all of 
whose names and places of 
residence are unknown, and 
all unknown claimants, whose 
names and places of residence 
are unknown, all of said 
parties 	DEFENDANTS, 
GREETING: 

You are hereby commanded 
to appear by filing a written 
answer to the Plaintiffs' Peti-
tion at or before ten o'clock 
A.M. of the first Monday after 
the expiration of forty-two 
days from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same 
being Monday the 6th day of 
February, 1978, at or before 
ten o'clock A.M. before the 
Honorable District Court of 
Parmer County, Texas, at the 
Court House of said County in 
Farwell, Texas. 

Said Plaintiffs' Petition was 
filed in said court on the 19th 
day of December, A.D. 1977, in 
this cause, numbered 4267 on 
the docket of said court, and 
styled: 

JOHNNIE FLOYD MORRIS, 
AND WIFE, MARILYN 
MORRIS, 	Plaintiffs 

vs. 
E.J. JOHNSON, ET AL, 

Defendants. 
The names of the parties to 

the cause are as follows: 
Johnnie Floyd Morris, and 

his wife, Marilyn Morris, are 
Plaintiffs, and E.J. Johnson 
and wife, Maye Johnson, Mike 
Britting and wife, Annie Brit-
ting, M. Britting and wife, 
Annie Britting, Anna Britting, 
Anma Britting, Della Porter, 
Ella Porter, C.P. Wirth, C.M. 

and Berry pumped in 12 in the 
losing effort. White added 2. In 
rebounds, Vicki Vinton made 
12. 

According to Coach Bob 
Askey, the "girls played much 
better overall." 

...•• 

In the first game played 
since the holiday break, the 
Junior Varsity girls swept past 
Roosevelt, 44-29. High scorers 
were Jana Berry and Lisa 
Hughes with 10 each. Also 
scoring were Sharmy Chris-
tian, 5; Kim Marsh, 4; Karyn 
Blain and Gina Eubank, 3 
each; Dondra Genies, 2; and 
Carole Perkins, 1. 

The JV girls are now 8-4 
following Tuesday's victory. 

"They played well consider-
ing they were off for two 
weeks," commented Coach 
Larry McDorman, who added, 
"They are slowly improving." 

S.... 

Tonight (Friday) the Steers 
and JV boys and Steerettes 
and JV Girls meet Plains and 
Olton, respectively. Next 
Tuesday, Jan. 10, the varsity 
boys and girls and JV boys 
take on Hart in the first round 
of District 3-A action. 

• • • 

Farwell Steers invaded the 
Muleshoe Basketball Tourna-
ment December 29-31 and 

:;ip..when the excitement and 
action ended, the Blue and 
White not only captured the 
first place trophy but also had 
three players - Russ Jones, 

ka Rowdy Chandler and Keevin 
Kelley - named to the All 

1.:fiournament team. 
In the first game, the Steers 

:LI  romped past Floydada, 59-42. 
Jones and Chandler tied for 

-4 high point honors with 19 each, 
followed by Keevin Kelley -4 
with 13. Also scoring were 
Clay Roberts, 4; Vick Chris-

Zafian and Robin Roberts, 2 
each. 

Next, the Steers tangled 
with Muleshoe, coming away 
with a 45-35 victory. Jones 

---,pumped in 19 points to take 
high point honors and Kelley 
added another 12 points. 

'ethers scoring were Rowdy 
II  Chandler, 9; Roberts, 4 and 
%Christian, 1. 
".1 In the final showdown Far-
%well faced Abernathy, downing 
.4 their opponents, 65-55. Kelley 
%%was high with 24 points and 

Chandler added 12. Also scor- 
ing were C. Roberts, 8; 
Christian, 6; and Kayle Watts, 

'a 5. 
The Steers certainly proved 

•<, 

!'4  

• 

PHONE 
481 - 3681 

Published in State Line Trib-
une Dec. 23, 30, 1977 & Jan. 6, 
13, 1978. 

BEFORE TUESDAY 
5 PM TO PLACE 

YOUR WANT AD ! 
44  

ONE CALL 
CAN REACH 
THOUSANDS 

The Steerettes also traveled 
to Muleshoe for the tourna-
ment, losing two games in a 
row. 

The first match pitted the 
girls in Blue and White 
against Shallowater, with the 
Steerettes suffering a 43-36 
loss. Jamye Berry and Paula 
Christian each pumped in 12 
points, followed by Yalonda 
Martin with 8 and Peggy 
White, 4. 

The Steerettes lost the 
second battle against Little-
field, 39-35. Christian made 21 
points, followed by Berry with 
8, Peggy White, 4, and Martin, 
2. 

S.... 

The Steerettes tangled with 
Roosevelt Tuesday night of 
this week losing 58-45. Chris-
tian hit the mark for 31 points 

CA L L  

	 HARRY 

r- 
Escapologist Harry Houdini's real name was Ehrich Weiss. 



Blanket 

Of Snow 

It was a week late for a white Christmas, but snow did usher 
in the New Year with the Twin Cities receiving less than an 
inch while the surrounding area received approximately two 
inches. A thin layer of white covered Texico and Farwell 
Monday morning, but it melted when the sun came from 
behind the clouds later in the day. 

HI 	  
Not satisfied with his invention of the world's first horse-
drawn 

 
refrigerator car, fish merchant William Davis of 

Detroit built the world's first railroad refrigerator car a year 
later, in 1869. 

Up On The 

Rooftops 

The cars and roof tops in Texico and Farwell were still 
covered by a thin blanket of snow on Monday morning. The 
winter blast began New Year's Day and continued until late 
evening, creating hazardous driving conditions for holiday 
travelers. Late Monday the snow melted, leaving hardly 
trace of Mother Nature's handiwork. 

BISCUITS 
	

Shurfresh 10 Count 
	 8 $1.00 

CHILI 
	

Wolf Big 19 Oz. Can No Beans 
	

7 

CATSUP 
	

Hunts 32 Oz. 	 a 

ICE CREAM 
	

Borden's Sq. Half Gallon 

TOILET TISSUE 
	

DeIsey 4 Roll Pack 
	

7 
COCOA MIX 	Swift Miss 12 Count Box Inst. 	Box 99' 
TOMATO SOUP umP611 "0 Can 	5 4.00 
TUNA 
	

Chicken of Sea '/:oz. Oran Labia 

TAMALES 
	

Ellis No. 21/2  Jumbo 

KRISPY CRACKERS 	Simkins 1 Lb B" 

BUTTERMILK 
	

Borden's Half Gallon 
	 a 

SWIM 

SHORTENING Shuffle. 3 lb. Can "Pure Vegetable" 

BEEF LIVER 
	

Sliced-Skinned-Deveined 	lb. 4 

CANT FOODS 
LYE s 	

DOUBLE STAMPS 
ON WEDNESDAY 

s OPEN TIL 9 O'CLOCK 

STAMPS 	
EVERY NIGHT 	. 	 

Redeem U.S.D.A. Food Slam!, 7
ST 

 77 

FARWELL 
CLOVIS 

WE FEATURE 

SHURFRESH MILK 

WE FEATURE 
TENDER CRUST 

BREAD 

ENCHILADA DINNERS 	Petie 13  Oz. Beef 

Assn), PIZZA 	Chef Boy-at-dee 13 Oz. 	Each 69t 
POTATOES 
	

Colo. 20 Lb. Bag Russet 
	 1.2' 

CABBAGE 
	

Texas Firm Head 	 Lb. 

ORANGES 
	

Texas 5 lb. Bag Juice 	 Bag 

TURNIPS 
	

Calif. Purple Top 

PORK SAUSAGE 	Top Hand 2 Lb. Bag 

BOLOGNA 
	

Wilson 12 Oz. Pkg. All Meat 	Pkg. 
I a 

ROUND STEAK 
	

Choice U.S.D.A. 	th$1.3 
SIRLOIN STEAK 	U.S.D.A. Choice 	Li, 4.29 

Pogo II-State Line Trlbun•, Friday, Jaunary 6, 197$ 

Snow 
Provides 
Little 
Moisture 

Sunshine and warmer tem-
peratures returned to the Twin 
Cities and surrounding areas 
this week following a brief 
blast of winter which struck 
the area Sunday, depositing up 
to two inches of snow in some 
parts of the Panhandle. How-
ever, less than one inch of 
snow was received locally and 
by late Monday afternoon a 
persistent old Sol had melted 
the thin layer of white. 

The light snow storm was a 
bit late for a white Christmas, 
but it did cause hazardous 
driving conditions as holiday 
travelers were returning 
home. The area highways and 
city streets were quite slick as 
motorists slowly and carefully 
navigated their way over the 
iced asphalt. 

This storm followed on the 
heels of another equally short 
bout of winter which attacked 
the area a few days before 
Christmas. Approximately two 
inches of snow fell during that 
storm, but again the sun came 
from behind the clouds and 
melted it before residents had 
much of a chance to enjoy the 
first snow of the winter 
season. 

Concerning the wheat and 
barley crops planted in Par-
mer County, Mack, Heald, 
county extension agent, said 
the recent snows "were of 
little benefit" because they did 
not provide much moisture for 
the crops. "Moisture is really 
needed now," he added. 

Local Men 

Student 

Teaching 

Kenneth Shaw, Texico Jun-
ion High principal, has re-
leased the following honor 
rolls for the second nine weeks 
and the fall semester. 

Second Nine Weeks 
Sixth Grade: Rodney Dick-

erson, Dana Morris and Kevin 
West. 

Seventh Grade: Danny Reid, 
Rebecca Schwartz, Ruth Ann 
Scott, Sharlett Taylor. 

Eighth Grade: Anna Flores, 
Sammy Garcia, Esther Quin- 

tana, Alan Baldridge, Tony 
Bradley, Lisa Crooks, Jeff 
Day, Tracy Dobbs, Jeff Duns-
worth, Todd Genies, Kent 
Harding, Jo Beth Hill, Sandra 
Holley, Craig Horne, Jill 
Jesko, James Kelley, Patricia 
Rojas and Carey Ruszenas. 

Fall Semester 
Sixth Grade: Rodney Dick-

erson, Ronnie Dunsworth, 
Kevin West. 

Seventh Grade: Rebecca 
Schwartz, Ruth Ann Scott,  

Sharlett Taylor. 
Eighth Grade: Anna Flores, 

Man Baldridge, Tony Bradley, 
Lisa Crooks, Jeff Day, Tracy 
Dobbs, Jeff Dunsworth, Todd 
Geries, Kent Harding, Jo Beth 
Hill, Sandra Holley, Craig 
Horne, Jill Jesko, James 
Kelley, Patricia Rojas and 
Carey Ruszenas. 

"There is always room at the 
top." 	Daniel Webster 

In a nutshell! 

March of Dimes 
TO PROTECT THE UNBORN 
AND THE NEWBORN 

Texico Junior High 
Releases Honor Rolls 

Kevin Kaltwasser of Farwell 
and Billy Carlyle of Texico are 
fall semester student teachers 
at Eastern New Mexico Uni-
versity at Portales. Kaltwas-
ser is student teaching in 
social studies at Portales High 
School, while Carlyle is in 
special education at Texico 
High School. 

All education majors are 
required to student teach in 
order to receive teaching 
certification. The purpose of 
student teaching is to provide 
an on the job, first hand 
experience of working in the 
classroom. It is also a period 
when professional educators 
evaluate the student's abilities 
as a teacher. 

If you're cooking with 
electricithyou may be 
eating up too much of 
your budget. 

Ittakesa lot of electricitytogeta coil 
hot enough for cooking. Besides being 
inefficient, it may be just plain more 
expensive. 

That'swhytheclean, blue Philgasflarne 
iscooking so many great meals all over 
thecountry. 

You can seetheflameand can control it 
immediately. higher or lower. And when 
you turn it off, its off. There's no long cool-
down period. 

These days, when the cost of food is 
so high, there's no reason thecost of cook-
ing it should be, too. Come by and let us 
show you how Philgas efficiency may make 
your energy bill a lot easier to swallow. 

HELTON OIL CO. 
Serving The Texico-Farwell Area 

Ph. 481.3222 
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