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Heat Wave Broken - 
sstitw4i3.0 

How Hot Was It? 
It was 100 degrees in the shade at Sherley-Anderson-Pitman elevator in Farwell early last 
Friday afternoon. Bookkeeper Bobbie McFarland applies an ice bag to the head of elevator 
manager Fred Chandler as the temperature soared to the century mark. Thermometers in 
the area registered 100 or more degrees several days during the past week until the record 
heat wave was brought to a halt late Monday evening by a heavy thunderstorm that left 
hail and wind damage in its wake. Good amounts of rain were reported in some areas while 
others close by reported only traces of moisture from the fast moving storm, Except for 
hail damage to area cotton and corn crops, the general consensus was that the moisture 
was generally welcome. 

Storms Rake Area; 

Crop Damage Heavy 
Summer began officially at 

1:39 a.m. CDT Tuesday, but 
from the weather which has 
plagued the Twin Cities area 
since Monday night it is hard 
to imagine that summer days 
are here again. Additional rain 
and cooler temperatures were 
also evident Tuesday night. 

Since last week weather in 
the Twin Cities area and 
throughout Parmer County has 
run the gauntlet from 100 
degrees plus temperatures to • 
a brief but violent wind, rain 
and hail storm which blasted 
the local area late Monday 
evening. 

Hardly had Clovis weather 
advisories warned of high 
winds and possible rain when 
a dust-colored sky blanketed 
the area and within moments 
a 50-mile-per-hour wind blew 
through the area bringing with 

Last week's U.S. News and 
World Report carried an 
interesting article based on a 
1975 survey of the U.S. Depart-
ment of Commerce. This 
survey gave the per capita 
incomes of the top 100 counties 
of the 3,138 in the United 
States. In this national ranking 
Parmer County came in 11th. 
It showed a per person income 
for Parmer County of $11,715 
before personal income tax 
but after Social Security and 
other government retirement 
program contributions. 

This statistical tidbit can be 
interpreted a number of ways, 
but it is a piece of information 
that ought to be loudly 
trumpeted about in our local 
quest for a physician. Large 
incomes are something our 
medical men seem to under-
stand very well indeed. 

It is an economic fact that 
ought to impress businessmen 
in considering future expan-
sion plans and in some 
measure bring in additional 
people and jobs to our area. 

Locally it ought to spur us in 
the quest for these additional 
jobs and businesses. We real-
ize that this income figure is 
derived right now from our 
farm economy. As the price 
for our locally grown crops is 
sinking and agricultural costs 
spiral, this economic level will 
not be sustained unless we 
find other sources of revenue 
and capital for job production 
in our area. 

It says to us that we have a 
good economic base to build 
upon, but that we cannot be 
complacent about the future of 
Parmer County and that we 
must work hard to preserve 
our economic well being. 

it heavy rains and hail. 
During the storm trees were 

stripped of branches and 
leaves, streets were flooded 
and cable television service 
was disrupted for about an 
hour. 

Mrs. Ben Mesman' ofOkla-
homa Lane reported that the 
front section of the roof of 
their hay barn was torn off 
during the wake of the storm 
which struck about 7:30 p.m. 
CDT. She commented that the 
force of the wind carried 
pieces of the roof to neighbor-
ing farms. 

She added that the hay barn 
was similarly damaged two 
years ago during another high 
wind storm. Mrs. Mesman 
also said that the rain and hail 
which fell during the storm 
also damaged their alfalfa hay 
crop. 

Texico School Board Has 

Meeting, Budget Hearing 
$61,685; operation of plant 
(custodial services, electricity, 
natural gas etc.): $50,993; 
maintenance of plant: $14,076; 
fixed charges (Social Security, 
workmen's compensation etc. ( : 
$80,448; 

Texico Pool Offers 

Swimming Lessons 

And, non instructional stu-
dent support (athletics, trips 
etc.( : $7,200; capital outlay 
(improvement to buildings, 
land and new equipment etc.): 
$36,341; operational emer-
gency fund: $33,604; debt 
service: $10,553; principal or 
bonds: $75,553; federal pros 
pects (Titles I, IV, VI, mi-
grants etc): $39,304. 

at Texico Schools. He said 
every year the budget is 
drawn up based on an 
expected enrollment for the 
coming school year. 

The total budget tentatively 
approved for the upcoming 
school year is $925,768. A 
breakdown of costs and ex-
pected expenditures is as 
follows; administration ex-
penses: $40,965; direct instruc-
tion (salaries for teachers, 
aides, etc.): $398,673; instruc-
tional report (assistants, li-
brarians, principals, audio vi-
sual expenses etc.): $84,038; 

Also, health services: $2,888; 
pupil transportation service: 

Jack Roach Rites 
Conducted Monday 

Texico Woman's Club is 
sponsoring a swimming party 
tomorrow night (Friday) from 
6 to 8 p.m. MDT in apprecia-
tion of all the volunteers who 
helped in any way with the 
pool restoration project. Aud-
rey Kittrell, spokesman for the 
organization, said that anyone 
who helped with the work, 
donated funds or who is a 
member of an organization 
which either donated funds or 
labor, is invited to attend the 
special party. Refreshments 
will be served. 

area who had not quite 
finished wheat harvest "might 
have to wait a day or two 
before getting back into the 
fields." He added that they 
received an additional 1.8 
inches of rain Tuesday night. 

Mrs. Bert Williams, south-
east of Farwell, reported that 
their farm received quite a bit 
of hail which damaged their 
cotton and corn crops. 

The Ted Magness farm 
south of Farwell received hail 
damage to cotton and corn 
crops . While receiving from 
one and one-fourth to one and 
one-half inches of rain during 
the storm. The rain was 
spotted in that area and the 
area south of West Camp did 
not appear to be adversely 
affected by the sudden storm; 
however, this vicinity did 
receive beneficial moisture 
late Tuesday. 

Jimmy Curtis, who farms 
south of Farwell on the east 
side of the State Line Road, 
says he received heavy hail 
and wind damage to his crops, 
with some 50 acres of cotton 
being almost destroyed. 

The Joe Blair and John 
Armstrong farms in the south-
east of Farwell aiso received 
heavy damage to corn crops. 

Many farmers agreed that 
the high winds caused consid-
erable damage to the young 
plants, splitting leaves and 
bending and tangling the 
stalks. 

Waters from the hard rains 
also played havoc with some 
of the country roads, washing 
almost one-foot deep gullies in 
places as the waters flooded 
from broken borders in fields 
and swept down the road beds. 

Mack Heald, Parmer County 
Extension Agent, reported that 
the bulk of the crop damage 
occurred south, southeast and 
southwest of Farwell. He 
called the damage to cotton, 
vegetable and wheat fields 
permanent, but said that the 
damaged corn fields had a 
"chance to recover." 

Throughout the county high 
winds, rain and various sized 
hail pelleted crops and in 
some instances stalled wheat 
harvest. Prior to the storm 
Monday night Heald said that 
60 per cent of the wheat in the 
county had been harvested. He 
said the rest could be com-
pleted in a few days if "we do 
not get any more rain." 

According to the County 
Agent, dryland yields ranged 
from 10-40 bushels per acre, 
adding that the latter figure 
was harvested in the Rhea 
area. He commented that 15-20 
bushels was an average yield 
this year. Irrigated fields 
yields were running between 
50-80 bushels per acre, with 
60-65 bushels being an average 
yield. 

Mrs. B.A. Rogers of Texico 
reported .6 of an inch of rain, 
adding that a "hard hail fell 
for about two to three min-
utes." Mrs. Beverly Rogers 
who lives two miles north of 
Pleasant Hill reported that 
they received light rain and no 
hail or high winds. Archie 
Tarter reported a measure-
ment of 1.2 inches for Monday 
and Tuesday night. 

Asa Smith of Sherley-Ander-
son Grain in Lariat said that 
they received about 1.2 inches 
of rain and no hail. He added 
that a few farmers in that 

Texico Swimming Pool will 
offer beginner's swimming 
lessons starting July 5, says 
Kathy Culshaw, pool manager. 
A fee of $7 will be charged for 
10 lessons which will be given 
over a two-week period, adds 
Miss Culshaw. 

Tentative plans call for con-
ducting one class in the 
morning and one in the after-
noon, but "that will depend on 
the enrollment," says the 
Texico woman. Miss Culshaw 
states that she will probably 
conduct the classes on a 
Monday through Friday basis. 

Anyone interested in the 
swimming lessons is urged to 
register next week at the pool 
office. Schedules of classes 
will also be available in the 
office, says Miss Culshaw. The 
pool is open Monday through 
Saturday from 1:30 to 5:30 
p.m. MDT. 

Texico School Board adopted 
a resolution to disassociate 
Texico Municipal Schools from 
Eastern New Mexico Univers-
ity vocational school, Clovis 
campus, at its regular meeting 
June 14. 

James Pierce, superinten-
dent, explained that under the 
terms of the original contract 
Texico students could attend 
the vocational school at a 
lower rate, adding though, 
that at the same time Texico 
Schools was also responsible 
for its share of any bond issue 
passed by the school. 

Pierce went on to say that 
as the school was about "to 
float a bond" it was in the 
best interest of Texico to 
withdraw its membership. He 
added that "we really did not 
receive all that much benefit 
from the arrangement any-
way." The Texico superinten-
dent also said that they 
followed the recommendations 
of the Attorney General of 
New Mexico as to how to 
withdraw from membership in 
the community college. 

A bid was also accepted 
from Whitfield Brothers Con-
struction Company in Clovis to 
tear down the old gym which 
had been built in 1926. 

Resignations were accepted 
from Bettie Martin, high 
school secretary; Betsey Aut-
rey, elementary secretary; 
and Nora Romero, elementary 
teacher. Linda Harrison, who 
was an aide at the elementary 
school this past year, will 
succeed Mrs. Autrey as the 
elementary secretary. 

A maintenance bid for the 
schools' office machines was 
accepted from Tunnell Busi-
ness Machines in Clovis. 

An official budget hearing 
was also held last week and 
according to Pierce, the bud-
get for the 1977-78 school year 
has been tentatively accepted 
by the state. Pierce explained 
the final budget approval will 
depend on the fall enrollment 

Reward 

Fund 

Growing 

JACK 0. ROACH 

Frank Edwards, Gene Snod-
grass, Wendol Christian, and 
John Lin Riddle. 

Honorary pallbearers were 
men of the Oklahoma Lane 
Baptist Church, and Clyde 
Perkins, R.E. Blankenship, 
Sam Billingsley, Ponce Bil-
lingsley, Gabe Anderson, Gene 
Ezell, George Douglas, Lacy 
Hardage and Donald Chris-
tian. 

Funeral services for Jack 
Oran Roach, 85, of Oklahoma 
Lane were held Monday at 
3:30 p.m. CDT in the Okla-
homa Lane Baptist Church 
with the Rev. Moody Smith, 
pastor, officiating, assisted by 
Rev. Jess Terry of Bovina. 

Mr. Roach died Saturday, 
June 18, in Clovis Memorial 
Hospital. Burial was in the 
Bovina Cemetery under the 
direction of Steed-Todd Funer-
al Home. 

Mr. Roach, a retired farm-
er, moved to Parmer County 
in 1930 from Turkey, Tex. He 
was a member of the Oklaho-
ma Lane Baptist Church and a 
veteran of World War I. 

Survivors include his widow, 
Nell, of the home; one son, 
James, of Bovina; one daugh-
ter, Mrs. Lloyd Gober of 
Bovina; one sister, Mrs. 
Lucille Reynolds of Odessa; 
and four grandchildren. 

He was preceded in death by 
one son, Jack, Jr.; and one 
daughter, Billie Jean. 

Pallbearers were Harold 
Carpenter, Sterling Donaldson, 

Last Friday Governor Dolph 
Briscoe signed a bill requiring 
schools with more than 10 per 
cent poverty level students to 
conduct a free breakfast pro-
gram beginning in 1978. This 
glaring example of Big Bro-
ther's social legislation, we 
understand, was approved by 
a two-thirds majority in each 
legislative chamber. Where, 
oh where is the voice of 
responsibility in the halls of 
the Texas legislature? 

This monstrosity, it is said, 
will not cost local taxpayers, 
as it will carry a federal 
subsidy. What a bald-faced 
misstatement of fact; or is it 
that a large majority of Texas 
citizens do not pay Federal 
taxes? We get bare knuckle 
mad at such weasling, self-
serving deceitful statements 
as, "it won't cost anything as 
the Federal government will 
pay for it." Figure out how 
much you ship off to Uncle 
Sam against how much you 
pay to the State of Texas and 
to your local taxing author-
ities. Uncle's bite dwarfs all 
other tax payments almost 
beyond comparison. 

That such a morally obscene 
piece of legislation could come 
out of the Texas Legislature 
leads us to conclude that its 
leadership does a better job of 
following the socialistic line 
than representing the more 
conservative trends of their 
constituents. 

This is a "Pandora's Box" 
that will plague the admini-
stration of school districts 
from now on. Wait until all the 
ramifications of this bill are 
thoroughly explored. If you 
think that school budgets are 
high now, this gem will send 
them out of all reason in 
future years. The cost of the 
actual food will be piddling, 
but the hidden iceberg will be 
the additional utilities, help, 
transportation, reports, and 
lastly, the cruel blow dealt to 
family responsibility. 

The reward fund established 
last week by Texico and 
Farwell residents for informa-
tion leading to the conviction 
of intruders who terrorized a 
rural family north of Farwell 
early in the morning of June 
13 is growing and building 
daily. According to Joe Jones 
of Security State Bank, $625 
was in the fund as of Tuesday 
afternoon. The Citizens Bank 
in Texico is also accepting 
contributions to the reward 
fund. 

Parmer County Sheriff Char-
lie Lovelace said they were 
still investigating the case and 
at present were following up a 
tip which they had received 
earlier this week. Otherwise, 
he noted, there were no new 
leads. Sheriff Lovelace said 
they now believe that three or 
more men might have been 
involved with the attack on the 
family. 

In addition to terrorizing the 
family, the assailants alleged-
ly took guns and an estimated 
$360 in cash from the home. 

Speaking of political chic-
anery, backed by the unions, 
Congress is about to make a 
totally unwarranted power 
grab. They are proposing to 
repeal the Hatch Act that has 
kept federal employees from 
being used as political pawns 
by incumbent politicans. If 
this repealer passes• look for 
greater chaos in our Federal 
bureaucracy as only hacks 
and bums will then want 
such a job. When a Congress-
man can squeeze every fed-
eral employee in his district, 
he can never be defeated. 

To oppose this repealer bill 
contact Senators Tower and 
Bentsen at Senate Office 
Building, Washington, D.C. 
20510 as soon as possible. 

Little League Games 	
Wind Damage 

Puppets 

At VBS 

"Do puppets really go to Vacation Bible School, too?" asks 
four-year-old Tina Harper, daughter of Minister and Mrs. 
Leonard Harper, Farwell. "Of course, we do," say Flossie 
and Ferdie who were featured attractions at the week-long 
school conducted at Farwell Church of Christ the past week. 
Puppeteers were Carolyn Meeks and Lisa Hughes, 

About 7 o'clock Monday evening the Texico-Farwell area was bombarded with a heavy 
thunderstorm which brought rain, hail and 50-mile-per hour and stronger winds. The 
short-lived storm wreaked havoc, seriously damaging some area crops, breaking tree limbs 
and flooding streets and roads throughout the area. This tree, near the Don Alana mobile 
home in Farwell, was heavily damaged by the extremely high winds. Tuesday morning, 
Alana decided to finish the job of pruning that Mother Nature had started. The Alanas' son 
Kelley can be seen in the background picking up the fallen branches. Other Twin City 
residents reported wind and hail damage to fruit trees and gardens. 

June 16 
Kelly Green 18-Aldridge 11 
Tide 13-Worley 1 
Monday night's games were 

rained out and will be played 
tomorrow night (Saturday) at 
the usual time. 
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Front Farm Tractor Tires 
DOUBLE RIB 	 5-RIB 
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HELTON OIL CO. 
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Investigating Thefts On The Farm 
In 

Parma County 
By MACK HEALD 

County Agent 

Speaking of statistics, Joe 
Jones of Farwell told me of an 
article in the June 20 issue of 
U.S. News & World Report, 
entitled, "Where People's In-
comes Run Highest". The 
article rates the top 100 
counties in the nation. These 
U.S. Department of Commerce 
figures are their latest re-
ported per person incomes for 
1975. Back in 1975, it shows 
that Parmer County was 11th 
in the nation. Loving County, 
Tex., was first and Sherman 
Counity was 7th. Farmer's per 
capita personal income was 
$11.715.00 	compared 	to 
$18,982.00 for Loving. 

• 

• 

Herman Gohlke Buried 

Sunday In Littlefield 
"Great men, like nature, use 
simple language." 

Vauvenargues 

were the 1976 field crops 
statistics, which are published 
annually by this state agency. 
As has been the case in the 
last few years, Parmer County 
was again the state leader in 
corn production. According to 
their figures, a total of 
40,165,700 bushels of corn was 
produced or 22.3% of the state 
total. Second behind Parmer 
was Castro County with over 
24 million bushels. 

Looking at the grain sor-
ghum statistics, Permer Coun-
ty was not even in the top ten. 
In 1970, Parmer County held a 
comfortable lead in Texas 
sorghum production, but most 
of this acreage has been 
replaced by corn. In fact, only 
three high Plains counties, 
(Hale, Floyd and Swisher) 
were listed in the top ten in 
sorghum production. 

Parmer County with ap-
proximately 1000 acres of 
sugarbeets, produced 24,200 
tons and a ranking of 4th in 
the state. Not included in 

mature and replanting be-
comes impossible. 

If the damage is suffered 
early, a crop can recover to 
the point that the injured 
plants are difficult to dis-
tinguish from undamaged 
plants. Also young cotton that 
survives early hail damage is 
often more mature at first 
frost than a crop that has been 
replanted. 

Damaging hail and wind hit 
the Farwell area late Monday 
afternoon, causing some perm-
anent damage to wheat, vege-
tables and cotton. Minor to 
moderately heavy damage 
was also inflicted on some 
corn fields. Dr. James Supak, 
Extension Cotton Agronomist, 
has a few points to make on 
hail damaged cotton. 

A first point to consider, the 
agronomist says, is how much 
of the field was damaged. A 
hail storm can reduce the 
plant population to only two 
seedlings per row foot in 40 
inch rows, (about 25.000 to 
30,000 plants per acre), and 
the crop can still produce a 
normal yield, unless, of 
course, the crop is poorly 
distributed or has long skips. 

Another point to consider is 
how much damage there was 
to plants. The agronomist 
explains that plants having 
only traces of leaves will 
recover better than those with 
no leaves. But he emphasizes 
that a seedling with no leaves 
can still make a crop. 

If the stem is intact, free of 
large breaks and the seedling 
has sound buds, recovery is 
still possible although it will 
be slower than plants having 
at least some leaves. 

However, if the stem is 
shattered and the bark loos-
ened or broken at points below 
the leaf buds, then recovery is 
impossible. 

After a hail storm, a 
sandfighter should be run as 
soon as possible to prevent 
sand injury to vital buds on 
stubs left in the field. Quite 
often, sand damage after a 
hail can do as much or more 
harm to young seedlings than 
the hail. 

Any regrowth hinges either 
on the sound terminal bud (the 
growing point) or axillary bud 
located at the point of leaf 
attachment. 

The specialist says that 
because of the young seed-
ling's ability to recover, hail 
injury in May or June will 
cause less yield loss than in 
July when the plants are more 

these 
small 
These 

Some interesting facts and 
figures were released this 
week by the Texas Depart-
ment of Agriculture_ These 

figures were cotton, 
grains and vegetables. 
are released separately 

Farwell. Sheriff Lovelace said 
the two men were illegal 
aliens and were turned over to 
Border Patrol officials. 

Sheriff Lovelace also re-
ported that they would travel 
to Chicago, Ill., later this week 
to pick up a prisoner, Regellio 
Fuentes, who had been in-
dicted for the burglary of the 
co-operative gin in Friona. He 
said Fuentes was arrested in 
Illinois on a Texas warrant, 
adding that bail bond jumping 
charges would be filed against 
Fuentes at a later date. 

The local law enforcement 
officer also said that they had 
arrested Ben Garcia in Deaf 
Smith County on a charge of 
bail bond jumping. He said the 
man would be taken to Hunts-
ville where he will begin 
serving an eight-year term for 
the burglary of the Harold 
Carpenter farm in Oklahoma 
Lane. Sheriff Lovelace said 
that prior to his arrest, Garcia 
had been missing for more 
than four years. 

Parmer County Sheriff Char-
lie Lovelace reports that a 
barn owned by Dale Christ of 
Friona was burglarized and a 
grain monitor, CB radio and 
antenna were taken. 

An attempted theft occurred 
at the Fred Horner place in 
Farwell. According to Sheriff 
Lovelace, Horner surprised 
two culprits in the act of 
attempting to steal his boat 
and outboard motor. Horner 
apparently frightened them 
away and reported the inci-
dent the following morning. 

Sheriff Lovelace said that 
two men were arrested by 
DPS officers on charges of 
possession of marijuana. The 
two men, Mark Wibel and 
Charles Duncan, both of Ama-
rillo, were fined $100 plus 
court costs and released. 

According to the local sher-
iff, Aguierre Vargas and 
Parra Caro, both of Mexico, 
were arrested for shoplifting 
in connection with an incident 
at Hughes Auto Parts in 

Funeral services for Her-
man Ernest Gohlke, 76, of 
Farwell were conducted Sun-
day afternoon in Emmanuel 
Lutheran Church in Littlefield 
with Rev. James Ristvedt, 
pastor, and Rev. Herman J. 
Schelter, pastor of St. John's 
Lutheran Church in Lariat, 
officiating. Burial was in 
Littlefield Memorial Gardens 
under the direction of Ham-
mons Funeral Home. 

Mr. Gohlke died last Wed-
nesday at Farwell Convale-
scent Center after a lengthy 
illness. He was born Sept. 29, 
1900, at Coryell, Tex. 

The retired farmer moved to 
Littlefield from Vernon in 
1941. He married Christa 
Hingst July 29, 1926, at 
Vernon. 

Survivors include his wife; 
four sons, Hubert of Farwell, 
Dr. Arthur of Atlanta, Ga.: 
Eldon of Littlefield and Ernest 
of the Azores Islands; four 
daughters, Mrs. Mildred 
Twenhatel of Victor, Iowa; 
Mrs. Alice Bauer of Las 
Vegas, Nev.; Mrs. Gladys 

Hobratschk of Littlefield and 
Mrs. Edith Bourland of Hollis, 
Okla.; 

Also, four sisters, Mrs. Ger-
trude Karcher of La Grange, 
Tex.; Mrs. Cornelia Schultz of 
San Angelo; Mrs. Olga Schultz 
of Sonora, Tex.; and Mrs. 
Alice Lowke of Vernon; and 20 
grandchildren. 

Andrew Green Dies Sunday In Clovis 
Funeral services for Andrew 

William Green of Clovis, 60, 
were conducted at 4 p.m. 
Tuesday from Steed Memorial 
Chapel with Rev. V. Ray 
Allen, pastor of the Bethel 
Assembly of God Church in 
Clovis officiating. 

Mr. Green died Sunday at 
Clovis Memorial Hospital after 
a lengthy illness. Burial was 
in Sunset Terrace Memorial 
Gardens in Farwell under the 
direction of Steed-Todd Fu-
neral Home. 

Mr. Green was born in 
Atoka, Okla., on Nov. 21, 1917. 

Prior to his illness he was 
employed at Doc Stewart 
Chevrolet-Buick as an auto 
mechanic. 

He was a veteran of World 
War II and served in the 
European theatre with the Air 
Force. 

Survivors include his widow, 
Bea; three daughters, Mrs. 
Sue Kirkland of Farwell, Mrs. 
Judy Richardson of Clovis and 
Rise Green of the home; three 
brothers, Clifford Green of 
Garland, Tex., Everett Green 

of Pampa, Tex., and Amos 
Green of Idaho; 

Also, his mother, Mrs. 
Florence Rex of Garland, 
Tex.; 10 grandchildren, in-
cluding Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Allan Kirkland, Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Kirkland, and Leigh Ann 
Kirkland, all of Farwell; and 
one great-grandson, Brandon, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Kirkland. 

Pallbearers were Allen Ray 
Boyd, Hal Stone, Cliff Gossett, 
Bobby Vinton, Jack E. Martin, 
and Jake Stovall. 
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Radio Dispatched 

Ph. 272-5514 

After Hours Phones 
Parts 925-6695 
Service 272-3180 

30" Sweeps - 
$19.95 Ea. 

WOOLEY-HURST 
in 	Muleshoe 

"1.0.0 .0% 	•••". • .e.ins•ansg.nons. 

American cattlemen's super 
efficiency is dramatically 
illustrated by some of the in-
formation released on food 
production and livestock 
numbers in the developing 
countries. About 60 percent of 
all cattle are in the developing 
countries ... about 8 percent 
in the United States. Our 8 
percent produces as much 
human food as their 60 per-
cent. In terms of food pro-
duction that makes the 
American cattleman 750 per-
cent more efficient. That's a 
good thing for all of us. Red 
meat consumption in the 
United States last year was 
over 145 pounds per person. 
Although beef consumption in 
other parts of the world is on 
the increase this year. last 
available figures showed their 
meat consumption to be sub-
stantially less than ours. In 
Russia it was just over 46 
pounds per person . . . less 
than 62 in Western Europe 
and only about 13 pounds per 
person in Japan. 

TUCKER 
EQUIP. CC. 

Highway 60-70-81 East 
Clovis, N.M. 

SUNFLOWERS 
THE"NET PROFIT" CROP 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The Board Of Equalization Of 

The Farwell Independent 

School District 

Will Meet Monday, July 11, 1977 

8 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

In The Office Of James Perkins 
Supt. Of Schools 

F. H 
AND fflo 

>ASSOCIATES %I 
NEW MARKETS THAT CONTINUE EXPANDING. 

EARLY CROP, FAST MATURING, FIRST ANNUAL INCOME 

___?-"TOTAL WATER REQUIREMENTS 60% OF OTHER CROPS 

4 

CABLE 

JNO-HERZ 

PRODUCERS PROCLAIM THE EASIEST CROP GROWN 

RESPONDS WELL TO FERTILIZER (WITH OR WITHOUT) 

OFF SEASON HARVEST (SPREADS WORKLOAD) 

FREEZE TOLERANCE, SAND RESISTANT, CONTROLS WEEDS 

IS ADAPTABLE TO ALL TYPES OF SOIL 

TOTAL CASH INPUT FOR CROP MUCH LESS 

TELEPHONE 
AREA CODE 806. 

792-4418 
1 

John F. Herter & Associates has a S12.00 

per 100 wt. contract available for producers planting 

in April. Harvested, before Sept. 10, gives "The Early 

Planner" a bonus and extra cash ahead of other fall crops. 

August weather • permits ideal harvest conditions. 

P.O. BOX 16267 
LUBBOCK, TEXAS 

TELEX'S 79490  

74-4448 

"THE SUNFLOWER PEOPLE OF WEST TEXAS"  

JOHN F. HERZER & ASSOCIATES 
MAIN OFFICES 

LUBBOCK 792.4418 	CLAUDE, TEX. 226.2481 

For Joint Venture contracts plant early. Take 
advantage of higher market prices ahead of 

the northern 1977 sunflower harvest crop. 

Our "Joint Venture Contracts guarantees the grower a base price per 100 wt. for his 
total sunflower crop and we share a 50% increase to the grower on a loint venture 
market price at harvest time above the base price guarantee, based on J.F.H. contracts. 
Good dryland crops yielding from 900 to 1500 pounds per acre. Good irrigated crops 
yielding from 1800 to 3000 pounds per acre. 

FOR THE FARWELL-TEXICO-CLOVIS AREA 
CONTACT JERRY MONK AT 

KELLY GREEN SEEDS 
Farwell 	 Ph. 481-3810 



Final Flag Raising 
Mrs. Asa (Lois) Smith, Lariat postmaster, officially raised 
the American flag at the post office for the last time Friday, 
June 17, as she retired from her post after 30 years of 
service. Mrs. Smith, who says she loves to paint, now plans 
to devote more time to her favorite hobbies. 

Lazbuddie Employs New 

Tax Assessor-Collector 
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all 9 advantages. 

1. Controls even resistant mites. 
2. One application normally does the job. 

3. Longer lasting than phosphates. 
4. Easy on ladybugs and other 

beneficial insects. 
5. Arrests mite damage in corn. 
6. Compatible with most pesticides. 
7. Can be applied by either ground or air. 
8. No re-entry restrictions. 
9. High return on investment. 

For complete details, talk to your dealer, consultant 
or custom applicator today. Uniroyal Chemical, 
Division of Uniroyal, Inc.. Naugatuck, CT 06770. 

aPIITE UNIROYAL As with any miticide. 
always follow instructions 
on the label. 
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Texico Church To 

Build Sanctuary 

Lariat Postmaster - - 
Lois Smith Retires 

After 30 Years 
At a special called business 

meeting Wednesday night, 
June 15, the congregation of 
the Assembly of God Church 
in Texico set forth a policy 
aimed at building a new 
sanctuary and educational fa-
cilities. 

Rev. J.M. Hutson, pastor, 
said it is the responsibility of 
the pastor and official board 

to carry out these policies. He 
said that "work will begin in 
the immediate future to en-
sure that these policies will be 
carried out." 

"The congregation is looking 
forward with great anticipa-
tion to being able to better 
meet the needs of our com-
munity," he concluded. 

Notice 
Hours for the summer 

reading program at Far-
well Elementary have been 
changed for the remainder 
of the sessions. 

Children may now check 
out books from 9:30 to 
10:30 a.m. and the story 
hour and film will be from 
10:30 to 11:30. The change 
was necessitated because 
of the large number of 
children participating in 
the reading sessions, says 
Mrs. Pat Owen, program 
coordinator, who reports 
that the elementary pro-
gram has been a tremen-
dous success. 

Hospital Notes 

Wes Hukill In 
Honor Society 
Wesley Hukill, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. W.D. Hukill of Far-
well was recently initiated into 
Phi Eta Sigma at West Texas 
State University. Phi Eta 
Sigma is a national scholastic 
honor society for freshmen. 

To be eligible for member-
ship, students must make at 
least half A's and half B's 
during their freshman year, 
according to Dr. Roy E. Tho-
man, professor of political 
science and faculty sponsor. 

The WTSU chapter, one of 
180 chapters at colleges and 
universities throughout the 
country, initiated 73 members. 

I 

four children, 14 grandchildren 
and one great-grandchild. 

A son Larry has a small 
ranch near Alamogordo, N.M. 
The three daughters are Mrs. 
Leon (Shirley) Ware of Bo-
vina; Mrs. Leamon (Joy) 
Stancell, south of Lariat and 
Mrs. Lonnie (Sylvia) Hand of 
Dillon, Mont. 

Mrs. Smith has several 
hobbies which she intends to 
pursue now that she has the 
time. She loves to sew, 
crochet, make quilts and do 
handwork, but painting with 
oils is by far her favorite 
pastime. She has taken oil 
painting lessons and has 
completed a number of paint-
ings. 

Mrs. Smith says she does 
not have any travel plans 
because "Asa still has to 
work." However, next month 
they plan a trip to Montana to 
visit their daughter and fam-
ily. 

I FIRE CALLS1 
Farwell Volunteer Fire De-

partment answered a call 
June 16 to a grass fire located 
two miles out on the Amarillo 
Highway. On June 17 they re-
sponded to a car and barn fire 
one mile east of Oklahoma 
Lane. That same day the 
trucks were called to Allsups 
in Farwell where they washed 
down a gas spill. 

They did not report any 
emergency vehicle calls. 

Texico Volunteer Fire De-
partment did not report any 
fire calls or emergency ve-
hicle calls this week. 

MF 1155 

114 Ft. Heavy Duty Offset Plow 
1-MF 155 Tractor - 50 HP 
1-MF 1105 Tractor, Cab, Air, 

Heater, Duals - 105 HP 
Heater, w/145 Front loader 

1-MF 1155 Tractor, Cab, Air, 
Heat, Duals, Dill. lock - 140 HP 

1-MF 1505 Tractor, Cab, Air, 
Heater - 190 HP 

1-MF 1977 - 750 Combine, 4/Speed, 14 Ft. 
1-MF 1911 -150 Combine, Hydro-Stat, 14 Ft. 
MF 160 Combines, V-8, Hydrostat, 14 Ft. 

USED EQUIPMENT 
1961 MF 410, Gas 
1-JD 1100 Combines w/Corn Heads 
1-MF 1150, Low Hours, Major O'Haul 
1-141rMotiibine 
1-MF 1100 Tractor Extra Clean 
1961 MF 410, Dsl. 

nesday, June 15, and released 
two days later. Barry reports 
that he is fine now. 

Mrs. J.B. Benderman of 
Texico was admitted to the 
Clovis hospital on Monday, 
June 13, for a check-up and 
medical tests. She reports that 
she was released on Friday 
and is feeling "pretty good" 
now. 

in accounting. He will take 
over the duties of the Tax 
Office on June 15. 

North On Grady Hiway - Clovis 

W.H. (Bill) Kent of Farwell 
was admitted Wednesday, 
June 15, to the Clovis hospital 
for treatment of ammonia 
burns. He was released the 
next day and is fine now, 
according to his wife. 

Barry Lindley of Texico had 
surgery on his right wrist at 
the Clovis hospital last week.  
He was admitted on Wed- 

	 1 AROUND THE 

TWIN CITIES 

Matthew Walker, three-year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Walker of Farwell, was ad-
mitted to the hospital in 
Muleshoe Friday where he 
underwent surgery. He was 
released last Saturday and is 
reported to be "improving and 
recovering slowly." 

Mrs. Ricky (Joyce) Ketcher-
side of Farwell was admitted 
to Clovis Memorial Hospital on 
June 15 for tests. She was 
released on June 17 and is 
"doing fine." 

Farwell City Council will 
meet Monday, June 27, at 5:15 
p.m. CDT in the City Hall. 

Preston Kolb has been 
employed by the Lazbuddie 
School as tax assessor-collec-
tor and bookkeeper, announces 
Sam P. Barnes, superinten-
dent. 

A native of Aspermont, Kolb 
was to move to Lazbuddie on 
June 1, to fill the vacancy 
created by the resignation of 
Mrs. Jewel Darling. Mrs. 
Darling has filled the position 
the past five years. 

Kolb is a 1972 graduate of 
Aspermont High School and a 
1977 graduate of Texas Tech 
University with a BBA degree 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

Parmer County Commission-
ers Court will convene Mon-
day, June 27, at 11 a.m. CDT 
in the county courtroom. 

Mrs. Asa (Lois) Smith of 
Lariat retired June 17 after 
serving as postmaster of 
Lariat Post Office for the past 
30 years. 

Mrs. Smith assumed her 
post in 1947 after retiring 
postmaster Mrs. Maggie L. 
Robertson had recommended 
her for the job. She had had 
no previous experience prior 
to accepting the position. 

During the last 30 years 
Mrs. Smith has been the only 
employee at the small post 
office and according to her, 
she "had to know a little about 
every aspect of the post office 
business." 

For several years Mrs. 
Smith operated both the post 
office and her home which 
required quite a bit of 
manuvering as the two were 
located in different parts of 
town. At that time the post 
office was located on the east 
side of the street from where 
it is presently located. 

Changes came about in 1951 
when the Smiths added a 
section to the front of their 
home which became the new 
post office building. Now the 
tiny quarters are bereft of 
postal paraphernalia because 
the facility has been tempor-
arily closed down. 

Mrs. Smith explained that 
for the present at least, there 
will be no new postmaster at 
Lariat nor will there be a post 
office. Now Lariat mail ser-
vice is being handled as a 
rural route out of the Farwell 
Post Office. The retired post-
master says that the matter of 
re-opening the Lariat Post 
Office has been taken "under 
advisement" and at present 
studies are being conducted. 

The Lariat woman says she 
always liked her job and found 
the work interesting. It was 
the first job she had ever held 
and she was "on call" eight 
hours a day. However, she did 
say that there were a lot of 
"changes which had to be kept 
up with." 

She recalls a humorous 
incident which occurred sev-
eral years ago when a woman 
came in to "stock up on 
stamps before the new postage 
increase went into effect." 

Mrs. Smith was born in 
Anderson County in east 
Texas, and moved to Lariat in 
1940 where she has lived ever 
since. 

She and husband Asa have 

SIIMUIERTUIE 

Letters To 

The Editor 
PIKES NM 

JUN 23-25,'77 

Farwell Chamber of Com-
merce will meet Tuesday, 
June 28, at noon at Clara's 
Restaurant. 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

•••••••••••\ tgo'S 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

Thanks for giving our 
church, the Oklahoma Lane 
Baptist Church, so much 
publicity during our 50th 
anniversary celebration. 

We appreciate your help 
very much. 

Mrs. Claude Watkins 

LI  DETERGENT 

Texico City Council will 
meet Tuesday, June 28, at 6:30 
p.m. MDT in the City Hall. 

Farwell Convalescent Center 
Auxiliary will conduct its 
meeting Friday, July 1, at 2 
p.m. in the dining room. 
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Prefinished Paneling 	 43.29 & Up 

PREFINISHED MOULDING & COLORED NAILS 

4x8 112 Sheetrock 	 12.24 

90 lb. Roll Roofing 	 17.95 

Portland Cement 	 13.25 

FREE DELIVERY TO 
MXICO & FARWELL 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

1201 E. First 
	

763-4437 
	

Clovis 
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WATCH THE 
SUM RISE 
Ever sit on the porch in the early morning watch-
ing the sum rise? Think of it . . . the dew 
turning to mist as you contemplate the total at 
the bottom of the page of your savings 
pass book. Compounded interest makes for a 
pretty spectacular sum rise. Next time you wish 
you had something more constructive to do 
round about the breal of day .. . drop in, we'll 
show you how to Watch the Sum Rise. It's all in 
your interest. 

NW TN FUNKY. euvmert 
/JISUP1 	Eli YOU! 

I 

a CHICKEN a RIBS 
.NOT LINKS 	•MILD LINKS 
•BURRITOS •COMI 

°DENMAN SAUSAGE 
AUDI BARBECUE BEEF 

.11110 BEEF SANDWICHES 
STORE SPECIAL BRANCH OFFICE I 

2nd and Abilene St. 1 FSLIC 
IPORTALES, N. MEX. --..--..---,-• 

SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION OF CLOVIS 

(DEPOSITS INSURED UP TO $40,000.001 

HOME OFFICE 
801 Pile St. 

CLOVIS, N. MEX. 

STORE SPECIAL 701 Ave. A 



FLOW METERS...... 
Pie20Metrie — 
surfoce 

FIRST STEP TOWARD WATER MANAGEMENT 
How much mileage are you getting from your irrigation water? 

Unless you have a handle on the number of gallons you pump, it's 
pretty difficult to tell how many gallons of water you use to 
produce a bushel of grain or a ton of alfalfa. 

One of the first steps toward improving your water 
management program should be the installation of a water flow 
meter. 

Call us today for more information about pump efficiency. 

364-1166 Ir 

Deaf Smith  
HELPING TEXAS GRO,W! 

REc, 
.; 

TELEX 
HEARING AIDS 

CLOVIS HEARING AID CENTER 
* Batteries * Molds * Free Hearing Tests 

SERVICE All MAKES 
403 E. 14th 	 Pho. 763-6900 

- 	• 1.4A"-„- 
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Couvateacest Cada Mt Chat 
Variety Club 

Has Meeting 
As Reported by the Center Staff 

from the Aycock's trees. Some 
of the cherries have been 
eaten individually and others 
have been made into pies. 

Nina Glasscock, Auxiliary 
volunteer, has donated several 
things to the Crafts room. 

Oklahoma Lane Variety Club 
met recently in the home of 
Janie Sides of Hereford. The 
afternoon was spent in visit-
ing, and refreshments were 
served. The next meeting has 
been set for July 19 when the 
Club members will have a 
luncheon meeting at a Clovis 
restaurant. 

Present for the meeting 
were Mesdames Dora Verner, 
Carrie Christian, Gertrude 
Foster, Cora McGuire and 
Janie Sides, 

All at the Center are 
saddened by the loss of 
Herman Gohlke and say they 
will really miss him. Floe 
Copeland, activities director, 
reports that a wheelchair fund 
has been established at the 
Center and several contribu-
tions have been made in 
Gohlke's name. Mrs. Copeland 
said the fund will be per-
manent as "wheelchairs are 
always needed." She also asks 
that anyone contributing mon-
ey to the Center to please 
specify which fund the money 
is to be used for. 

Floe's quote: "Anybody can 
be a heart specialist. The only 
requirement is loving some- 
body." Angie Papadakis 

* • • • • 

Clara Smalts has returned 
home (she lives across the 
street), but promises to return 
to the Center For visits. Marriage 

Licenses 
Three marriage licenses have 

been issued by the Parmer 
County Clerk's office since the 
last report, Those receiving 
the licenses were Lesley Ray 
Curtis and Kathy Jo White; 
Leslie Lois Deaton and lone 
Mildred Hickman; and Dennis 
Ray Willard and Tammy Lisa 
Christian. 

six-day-old-daughter, Deborah 
Redding and Holly of Canyon. 
Bobby Hix attended a roping 
contest in Bovina sponsored by 
his nephew Ricky Mason. 
Thomas Greathouse enjoyed 
an outing with Mrs. Copeland. 

W.W. Vinyard reports that 
his wheat is ready to cut. 
Recently, members of his 
family took him on a trip to 
inspect the wheat fields. 
Vinyard collected a wheat 
stalk and gave it to Elsie 
Elliott upon returning to the 
Center. 

When Christa Gohlke looks 
out of her window she sees a 
different scene than she has 
ever seen before. An old cream 
separator and old kettles have 
flowers growing in them now. 

• • • • • 
Working in the crafts room 

this week on the "old baggy" 
project were 011ie Utsman, 
Maude Wilson, Nora Edens, 
and Mary Mesman and Liz 
Kaltwasser Auxiliary volun-
teers. The grocery bag holders 
are made from burlap and 
have a felt cow glued on them. 
Mrs. Copeland says they have 
a "good supply on hand" and 
she invites everyone to "come 
in and look." 

In the language of flowers, 
the red chrysanthemum 
means, "I love." 

Rev. Harvey L. Whitten-
burg, pastor of Oklahoma 
Lane United Methodist Church, 
conducted Sunday afternoon 
worst,.,. —*vices. About 24 
persons attenueu. 

All the residents enjoyed a 
visit from Tonia Topliff and 
Sarah Caballero, first graders 
in the Vacation Bible School 
program at First Baptist 
Church in Texico, who pre-
sented the residents a scrap-
book of their VBS experience 
and recited their memory 
verses for the week. Sponsors 
of the children were Jimmy 
Robbins and Patti Hall, VBS 
instructors. 

Nora Edens was surprised 
by a visit from her niece and 

Margaret Aycock has do-
nated three large bags of 
cherries which were picked 

PICKUP 
LONG WIDE BED, FULLY FACTORY EQUIPPED, 

PLUS POWER STEERING, V-B, 

TURBO, OPTIONAL AXLE RATIO 

HEAVY DUTY REAR SPRINGS, 
FACTORY AIR, TINTED GLASS, 
PUSH BUTTON RADIO. DELIVERED IN CLOVIS It'-) 

77 CHEVELLE 
COUPE 

TINTED GLASS FACTORY AIR, GLASS, 

FACTORY AIR, POWER BRAKES, 350 

4 BARREL V-8, TURBO-HYDRAMATIC, 

STEEL BELTED WHITE WALL RADIALS! 

5 770G. . 0  

.$49990°  

%%%%%%%%%%%% \\‘',.\\\‘‘,..\\‘‘,..\\\NN‘NNNNN 

ii L 2-3 1, 56 ?890L 2 
co,  

151 
STEREO 

It 
CLOVIS ELECTRON MONTE CARLO 

TELEVISION 

1440 Main 
Clovis 

CLOVIS -a 

SHOPPING 

DIRECTORY 
PLUS FREIGHT 

PRICES START $496000 
AT ONLY 	

 

FREE!!! 
Stork 
Shop 

Infants and 
Maternity 

Wear 
1312 Main 763-7145 

AUCTION SALES 
Thurs. 7:30 P.M. 

MENNELL'S AUCTION 
108 Sycamore - 761-1581 tuff mamma of 

DOC STEWART 
CHEVROLET & BUICK 

ROTHWELL BODY SHOP 
ISI4 West 7th [Behind Chief's Automotive] Clovis. N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 For Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

3:4 400° 11 IN BENEFITS FOR O 
NEW & USED CARS 
THROUGH NADW. 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM -- 

LARGE SELECTION 
PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

0. L. ANDERSON. PRCFRIETOR 

617 MAIN STREET 

CLOVIS NEW MEXICO 

CONSUMER RELATIONS SYSTEM WHICH INCLUDES: 
NADW CONSUMER IDENTIFICATION CARD 
WORLD WIDE TRIP INFORMATION 
15% POWER TRAIN DISCOUNT CARD 
OVER $200 IN A NADW DISCOUNT COUPONS FOR PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE 

$500 THEFT PROTECTION REWARD TO DISCOURAGE THEFT 
TOLL FREE 24-HR. INFORMATION WATTS LINE 1-800-535-7090 
15% DISCOUNT ON TOWING CHARGES co iscouNT  

CHEVROLET - BUICK 

USA USN 	 N C 0 
ASSOCIATION 

USAF 	usmc 	CERTIFIED 
USCG 	 MERCHANT 

CLOVIS, N.M. 

0 

;0 

2500 MABRY DR. 



Hornes Return Home 
a. 

From Six-State Tour 1,t 
Rev. and Mrs. Joel Home 

and their children, Laura, 
Howard and Craig, of Texico 

tt: recently returned from a 
three-week trip. During their 
vacation the local family 
visited friends and relatives in 

tNew Jersey, New York, Wash- 
;i ngton, D.C., Virginia. Florida 

and D'Hanis, Tx. 
The Homes left Texico on 

May 23 and traveled to Strat-
ford, N.J., to spend four days 
in the home of his mother, 
Mrs. Edna Horne. On May 29 
Rev. Horne also preached at a 
church in Bridgewater, N.J., 
where a former resident of 
Texico, Gail Harrison, now 
lives. 

The Hornes enjoyed a family 
get-together while in Stratford 
and also attended a family 
reunion in Brooklyn, N.Y., 
before leaving for Florida. 

On the way to Florida the 
local family spent a few hours 
sight-seeing in Washington, 
D.C. They also spent the night 
in Partlow, Va., with their 
friends, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Sacra. 

In Dundee, Fla., the Homes 
visited her family, some of 
whom she had not seen in 15 
years. Present at the reunion 
which they attended were her 
mother and step-father, Mr. 
and Mrs. R.L. Glover of 
Dundee; and her brother, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Earl 1-6gen 

of Winterhaven, Fla.; 
Also, her sisters, Mr. and 

Mrs. Sam Abrams of Fort 
Myers, Fla., Mrs. Jerry Raney 
of D'Hanis, Tx., Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Neilsen of Tallahassee, 
Fla., Mr. and Mrs. Ken 
Benfield of Dundee, and Mrs. 
Dianne Willis, also of Dundee; 

And, her aunt and uncle, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Owens of 
Tampa, Fla.; and friends of 
the family, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Hansford of Marianna, 
Fla. 

On June 7 the Homes left 
Dundee to spend a day with 
her sister, Mrs. Joyce Neilsen 
in Tallahassee. Two more 
days of travel found the 
Hornes in D'Hanis, Tx., where 
they visited another sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Raney, 
whose family was unable to 
attend the reunion in Florida. 

Mrs. Horne commented that 
it was "a wonderful trip." She 
also expressed appreciation 
for the prayers of each 
member of their congregation 
at the First Baptist Church in 
Texico. 

Mrs. Horne reported that it 
was a safe trip with "no close 
calls." She laughingly men-
tioned that they saw six inches 
of rain during the duration of 
their trip, a blessing which 
New Mexicans dream about 
and pray for. 

West Camp Group 

Has Family Night 

Friends and relatives are 
invited to attend the wedding 
of Gwen Rundell of Farwell 
and Thomas Kenneth DeWitt, 
Jr. of Independence, Mo. 
tonight (Friday) at 8 p.m. 
CDT in the First Baptist 
Church in Farwell. 

The bride-elect is the daugh-
ter of Weldon Rundell and 
Georgia Rundell, both of 
Farwell, and the parents of 
the prospective bridegroom 
are Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
Kenneth DeWitt, Sr. of Inde-
pendence, Mo. 

Roy Donaldsons 

Have Daughter 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Donaldson 

of Oklahoma Lane are parents 
of their third daughter born 
June 16 at Clovis Memorial 
Hospital. 

The new arrival, who has 
been named Holly Ruth, 
weighed 10 pounds, three 
ounces and was 22 and 
one-half inches long at birth. 

Holly's sisters are Twila, 8, 
and Becky, 2. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Donald-
son of Oklahoma Lane and 
Mrs. Oleta Childs of Lubbock 
is the maternal grandmother. 

Visiting last week in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Sterling 
Donaldson of Oklahoma Lane 
were their daughter and three 
children, Mrs. Rodney (Jo-
lene) Decker, Jennifer, Julie 
and Jeffrey of Guymon, Okla. 
Weekend visitors included a 
son and fanily, Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Donaldson, Joe and 
Jayson of Wolfforth, Tex., and 
a daughter and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Ellison and 
Tiffany of Dimmitt. 

• • • * • 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Lee 
Jones and Micah of Oklahoma 
Lane were visited by her 
sister, Beth Walraven, of Fort 
Sumner last week. Visiting in 
their home this week are her 
grandmother, Mrs. Tom Dun-
can and her sister, Rena 
Brady, all of Fort Sumner. 

• • • • • 
Father's Day visitors in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. M.A. 
Snider, Jr., David and John of 
Farwell were their daughter 
and son-in-law Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Newton of Lubbock. 

FEEDING 77P 
MOST CATS DISLIKE COLD 
FOODS AND WILL REJECT 
Them SERVE Krrrris 
CANNED DINNERS AT 
RCOM TEMPERATURE. 

Zillion Russell 

BLACK AND I 

WHITE 	I 

DRAMA a 

Black and white V 

print bodice over I 

White poly 

sharkskin skirt 

I 

I 
THE FASHION SHOP 

410 Main 
-0 40 am, 	 4re 

az 3 5Cnow _ 

igs  yethunz xart 
„Lniate,T, 

gala EineX aua 

•=1 

Host couples for the West 
Camp family night held June 
11 at the West Camp Com-
munity Center were Mr. and 
Mrs. Barry Wilson and Mr. 
and Mrs. Willis James. 

Special entertainment was 
presented by Mrs. Barry 
Wilson and Mrs. David Bray 
in which three volunteers (Joe 
Rhodes, Barry Wilson and 
Lavon Rhodes) participated in 
a "quilt and strip trick." 

C.E. Grant, community chair-
man, conducted a short busi-
ness session. It was reported 
that a Bingo set has been 
purchased and will be used for 
a special family night, accord-
ing to host couples plans. 

For refreshments each fam- 
-4.4.4.4.4.4.4.4.4...M.M..........~4•••••••••••••••••••••• 

Creative Wedding , 
Service 

We do the complete 
reception for weddings 

and anniversaries. 

Cakes with hand molded 

flowers. 

Brass and Silver 

appointments. 

Assortment of cloths, 

draped and tailored 

4 Also specializiN i; birthday 
cakes and condy supplies 

Owners: Johnnie Battey 
Martha Lytal 

515 Star St. 	Hereford 
' 	Ph. 806/364-6711 

,zirs 
FOR ALL 
YOUR 
NEW & 
USED 
CAR, 
TRUCK & 
PICK UP 
NEEDS. 

'DOC' STEWART INC. 
2400 MABRY DR. 

Sensitivity is a very important part of our lives. In its natural function, 
it is our capacity to respond to stimulation We respond to light, to heat, 
to cold, to wind, to odors, and to many other external agents. Some 
people are more sensitive than others. Some of us are overly sensitive to 
some of the external agents in our environment, and this means that we 
have problems. 

There is another sensitivity which concerns us. It is in the realm of the 
spiritual, and involves our feelings. When we become too sensitive, we 
are a problem to ourselves and to everybody else. 

Being overly sensitive is not the Christian walk of life. All human 
relationships are made difficult, and some impossible, by the excessively 
sensitive person. 

The true Christian is "slow to anger'; "long-suffering"; and Christian 
love "takes no account of evil done to it." The Christian is also ready and 
quick to forgive. 

The Christ-centered life is strong, stable and well-balanced. Such a life 
is fashioned by obedience to Cod's word, and develops the toughness of 
Christian faith and love. 

Charmglow Electric Grill 
CART MODEL 

176" 
Plus Tax 

BUY THIS CHARMGLOW ELECTRIC GRILL AND GET 
ANY OF THESE ACCESSORIES AT '7.77 ea. PLUS TAX 

0-  - Vinyl Protective Cover 	  '7.77  
Regular price $10.50 

PUT IT ON YOUR ELECTRIC BILL 
OFFER EXPIRES JULY 31, 1977 

PATIO BASE 
MODEL 
'166" 

Plus Tax 

Rotisserie Basket 	 '7 77 
Regular price $13.50 ' Ps ' 

	'777 

'777 Rotisserie Kit 	 
Regular price $33.90 

Aluminum Shelf 	 
Regular price $8.50 

tlIAIIMIWI-11 MSSO 1110lN 6000 

ELECTRIC 
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Peggy Lonsdale Weds 

Kevin Stanley June 3 

+op com. em. 

Wedding I 

Reminder I 

I 

was covered with a blue cloth 
and lace overlay and centered 
with a single apricot carna-
tion. The three-tiered wedding 
cake was decorated with 
apricot roses. 

Servers were Lynn Robert-
son and her daughter Judy of 
Texico, the bridegroom's sis-
ter and niece; and Cindy 
Shannon of Ft. Gibson, Okla., 
the bride's cousin. 

The groom's table was 
covered with a blue cloth and 
lace overlay and was centered 
with a single blue carnation. 
Coffee and cake were served 
by Mesdames Matline Chum-
ley and Ida Jernigan. 

For a wedding trip to Albu-
querque, the bride chose a 
grey knit pant suit. She is a 
1977 graduate of Farwell High 
School and the bridegroom is 
a 1975 graduate of Texico High 
School. 

S 

MR. AND MRS. KEVIN STANLEY 

Carla Richardson Is 

Shower Honoree 

TEMPLE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

NOW MEETING 
FARWELL HIGH SCHOOL 

CAFETERIA 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening - 6:30 p.m. 
J.E. Whisenant 
Interim Pastor 

the first tier of the veil. The 
bride carried a bouquet of 
blue carnations and apricot 
gladioli. 

The bride wore as something 
old a locket which had been 
given to her by her aunt, 
Florence McGee of Rogers, 
Ark.; her wedding dress was 
something new; pearl earrings 
were borrowed from her 
cousin, Cindy Shannon of Ft. 
Gibson, Okla.; and the tradi-
tional blue garter. 

Betty Robinson of Clovis 
served the bride as maid of 
honor. She wore an apricot 
floral floor-length gown. Brides-
maids, Cathy Stanley of Texi-
co and Diana Wagner of 
Clovis, were attired in blue 
floral full length gowns. Each 
of the attendants carried a 
long stemmed apricot rose. 

Larry Albright of El Paso 
was best man. Groomsmen 
were Rick Hendrix and Craig 
Chumley of Clovis. Candle-
lighters were Jay Robertson of 
Texico and Marian Brumfield 
of Albuquerque, N.M. 

For her daughter's wedding 
Mrs. Lonsdale chose a floor 
length blue soft knit gown 
featuring blue lace overlay 
and a chiffon cape with 
matching lace. Mrs. Stanley 
wore a softly flowing red knit 
gown. They each wore an 
orchid corsage. 

The reception followed at 
the church. The bride's table 

1520 MITCHELL 
For Longer Lasting Flowers . . ily attending brought their 

favorite dessert. 
The next family night has 

been set for July 9. 
Those attending were Mr. 

and Mrs. Boyd Landers, Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Hunt, Curtis 
and Tori, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Rhodes, Jo Rhonda, Lavon 
and Dusty, Mr. and Mrs. 
David Bray, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Harris, Willie James, 
Leldon Phillips, Ernest Ramm 
and Clayton, Mr. and Mrs. 
Barry Wilson and Brandon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Willis James, 
Mr. and Mrs. C.E. Grant, 
Kevin, Laurie and Clay, and 
Jay Herington. 

Bettys Visit 
Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 

Clark Billingsley of Farwell 
for two weeks has been their 
grandson, Bob Betty of Law-
ton, Okla. 

Arriving on Wednesday of 
last week was their daughter, 
Mrs. Bo Betty and son Jeff. 
Bob returned to his home in 
Lawton with his mother and 
brother on Thursday. 

1520 MITCHELL - T3-310Z 
011ir a e 4.11.1w 	 441. 

and white were carried out in 
the decorations. The serving 
table was covered with a 
white lace cloth over a blue 
liner. Blue napkins were used 
and the centerpiece consisted 
of blue and white flowers. 

Refreshments of finger sand-
wiches, mints, nuts, and pine-
apple sherbet punch were 
served from crystal appoint-
ments. 

Corsages of blue and white 
carnations were presented to 
the honoree; her mother, Mrs. 
Roy Richardson of Texico; 
and the prospective bride-
groom's mother, Mrs. Gilbert 
Kaltwasser of Farwell. An-
other special guest was Ste-
ven's grandmother, Mrs. Ruth 
Kramer from Clovis. 

Carla Richardson of Texico, 
bride-elect of Steven Kalt-
wasser of Farwell, was hon-
ored with a bridal shower 
Tuesday night at St. John 
Lutheran Church in Lariat. 

Hostesses for the occasion 
were Mesdames Lillis Garner, 
Mary Helen Gohlke, Donna 
Haseloff, Pam Haseloff, Vickie 
Haseloff, Bobbie Jones, Jan 
Jones, Sherry Jones, Mary 
Kalbas, Bobbie McFarland, 
Mary Mesman, Bernice Nor-
ton, Mary Alice Ramm, Mar-
tha Schueler, and Sandra 
Turner. 

Hostess gift was a mixer 
and also the centerpiece which 
was used on the serving table. 

Carla's chosen colors of blue 

Peggy A. Lonsdale of Far-
well and Kevin Stanley of 
Texico were married June 3 at 
the First Baptist Church in 
Texico. Officiating at the 
double ring ceremony was 
Rev. Marion Brumfield, form-
er pastor of the Assembly of 
God Church in Texico. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene M. 
Lonsdale, Sr., of Farwell and 
parents of the bridegroom are 
Mr. and Mrs. Clark Stanley, 
Jr., of Texico. 

The couple exchanged vows 
before an altar setting consist-
ing of a 15-arch candelabra 
centered with an arrangement 
of blue carnations, apricot 
gladioli and palms, flanked on 
each side by a seven-branch 
candelabra trimmed with 
palms. 

Wedding music was provid-
ed by Johnie Lou Shannon and 
Sally Shannon of Ft. Gibson, 
Okla., cousins of the bride. 

The bride was attired in an 
original gown of white sheer 
imported organza taffeta. The 
high fitted bodice featured 
boutique type re-embroidered 
lace which enhanced the high 
mandarin collar, forming a 
v-shaped overlay both in front 
and in back. Daisy Venise lace 
accented the high, fitted 
waistline. Long bishop sleeves 
featured an overlay of lace 
forming a point at the elbow 
and the wide cuff of organza 
featured an overlay of scallop-
ed Venise lace. 

The cuff was highlighted by 
a wide ruffle of re-embroider-
ed lace trimmed in daisy lace. 
The full circle skirt of the 
gown featured a schiffle flounce 
of boutique lace. Scalloped 
Venise lace topped the flowers 
around the entire skirt which 
fell into a long chapel train. 
The bottom of the gown was 
trimmed in daily Venise lace 
and the front of the gown was 
accented by Venise cut outs 
sprinkled on the skirt. 

To complement the gown the 
bride wore a camelot head 
piece covered in white sata-
peau trimmed in daisy Venise 
lace. Venise motifs in clusters 
with seed pearls accented the 
head piece, and held in place 
a three-tier veil of imported 
sheer illusion. Daisy Venise 
motifs were scattered about 

On Dean's List 
Cheryl Gohlke, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Gohlke 
of Farwell. has been named to 
the Dean's List at Sam 
Houston State University for 
the spring semester. 

Miss Gohlke, a 1976 grad-
uate of Farwell High School, 
and home economics major, 
earned a 3.307 grade point 
average during the semester. 

The Dean's List consists of 
all students who have attained 
an average of 3.0 or better in 
all work attempted while 
earning not less than 12 
semester hours. 

Local Women Attend 

Purselley Reunion 
Mrs. Reatha Belle Grissom 

of Farwell and Mrs. Alma 
Boss of Texico were among 
the 98 persons attending a 
reunion of the Purselley fam-
ily at Mambrino, Tx., near 
Granbury on June 12. 

The local women were ac-
companied to the reunion by 
Mr. and Mrs. Lawson Wil-
liams and Rocky Williams of 
Clovis, and Mrs. Ann Pursel-
ley and Mrs. D. Ray Hungate 
of Westminister, Calif. 

u3et.. 6,43.. 9f. 
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CITY CLEANERS 
112 3rd -- Ph. 401-3384 

Farwell 
Alterations 	Turquoise 

Water Proofing -- Ties 

Leathers And Suedes 

Laundry Service -- Steamex Carpet Cleaning 

The site of the family get-to-
gether was a tabernacle that 
is 90 years old, located near 
the original Baptist Church 
which will hold dedication ser-
vices marking its 100th year 
on June 25. 

Mrs. Grissom and Mrs. Boss 
were daughters of the late 
Charlie Purselley and are 
among h's eight surviving 
children. They were reared in 
the small community where 
the reunion was held; how-
ever, a town no longer exists 
there, they say. Most of the 98 
persons attending (all related 
to the Purselley family) live 
near that vicinity or in the 
larger towns of that Central 
Texas area. 

The oldest person attending 
ws 84-year-old Mrs. Clara 
Purselley, sister-in-law of 
Charlie Purselley and the only 
surviving member of that 
generation of his family. The 
youngest in attendance was 
Tracy Purselley who is one 
year old. 

Sat., June 25 
10 a.m. • 2 p.m. 
at Capitol Foods 

Cakes, pies, cookies 
homemade bread 



B&M 

REFRIGERATION 

Heating & Air Conditioning 

Service All Makes 

Box 649 Horne Ph. 162-5864  
Far well, Tx. 	

Bus. Ph. 481-3262 

J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY, INC. 
Box 621 

Farwell, Texas 

Ph. 481-3288 

New Location - 109 Fifth Street 
OFFICE HOURS 

Monday - Friday, 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
Saturday. by appointment. 

* HAVE BUYERS - NEED FARM LISTINGS * 

160 A. irrigated, two miles north of Muleshoe on 
highway. 

381 A. irrigated, east of Muleshoe on Earth 
Highway. 

160 A. in alfalfa, circle sprinkler, four miles 
southwest of Muleshoe. 

Lays nearly perfect, 160 A. irrigated, 2 - 8 inch 
wells, 29% down, SE of Farwell. 

Nice 4 bedroom, 212 bath brick home, fireplace, 
with fenced back yard, car port, with storm 
cellar. 

Large 3 bedroor 	4th 1r4ck home, with fenced 
back yard near 	soWto appreciate. 

3 bedroom, 1 tInturcoasith basement, fenced 
back yard. G 	klat ationDias rental apartment 
in back. Price to sell. 

New 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick homes for sale. 

On farm living, extra nice 3 bedroom brick, 1 and 
'2 bath, with 40 X 80 quonset barn on 3 A. 

280 A. irrigated, on highway, excellent improve-
ments, lays real good. Immediate possession. 

3 • 75 ft. lots near city limits, with city water. 

160 A. irrigated, fully 
water area. 

tiled, lays real good. Good 

320 A. irrigated, 2 
perfect. Good water 
limits. 

8-inch wells, lays nearly 
area, near Farwell city 

160 A. irrigated, east of Farwell. Priced to sell. 

SAYING IS GREAT 

INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 
-Sales and Loans Are Our Service" 

SPECIALS OF THE WEEK 

Beautiful 80 A irrigated, dose in, lays nearly 
perfect, south of Farwell. 

3 bedroom, 2 bath, stucco house, fenced back 
yard. garage, storage building, basement, good 
location in Farwell. 

2 bedroom and 1 and '2 bath, brick house, double 
garage, finished basement, central heat, refrig-
erated air, good location, priced well below 
appraisal in Bovina. 

3 bedroom, 2 bath stucco, fenced yard with 
carport. near school in Farwell. 

Super location, nearly new, a real beauty, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath brick home, large living area. 
has a room for office or hobbies, extra large 
double garage. 

LAZBUDDIE MEET JESUS CRUSADE 
July 17-24, 1977 

MAKE YOUR PLANS NOW! 

Twin City Machine Works 
will be closed for vacation June 
24-July 4. 	

40-2k 

rage 6-State Line Tribune, Friday, June 24, 1977 N 

COURTHOUSE NOTES 

CARD OF THANKS 

Instrument report ending 
June 15, 1977 at County Clerk 
office Bonnie Warren, County 
Clerk. 

DEED - Rodney Dale Sager 
- Victoria Scott Sager - Sec. 
67, Blk. H, Kelly Sub. 

WD - Inez Morris - Charlie 
Lee Morris - tract out Garden 
lot 45 Sec. 31, T9S; RIE. 

WD - Donald W. Bradley -
Sally L. Clifton - lot 20, Blk. 1, 

Ridgeview, Friona. 

WD - Frio Development Co. 
Inc. - Eddie Hall - lot 42 & W. 
30 ft. lot 43 Blk. 2, Western 
Add. Friona. 

WD - G.B. & Lila Myrl 
Buske, Tr. - Bruce Kimball 
Buske et al - Und. aft int. out 
Sec. 9, T4u2S; R5E. 

WD - Don Shipley - William 
Volley Hodges - lot 52 & E. 5 
ft. lot 51 Blk. 2, Western Add. 
Friona. 

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
junk cars and tractors. Far-
well Pipe and Iron, 601 Avenue 
A, Farwell. Phone 481-3287. 

28-tfnc 

FOR SALE - Magnetic and 
Non-Magnetic signs. Made to 
order locally. Fina Station on 
U.S. 60. Ph. 481-9939. 10% 
discount with this ad. 	39-tfnc 

HOUSE FOR SALE by owner, 
three bedroom brick with 
storage building. 609 Ave. F. 
Call 481-3287 day or night. 

37 tfnc 

BOYD'S 
BRAKE 

AND 
ALIGNMENT 

1605 MABRY DR. 
763-4326 

We wish to extend very 
sincere and heartfelt appreci-
ation and thanks for all the 
prayers, expressed thoughts, 
and kindnesses shown to our 
family during this time of 
bereavement. We extend spe-
cial thanks to Rev. Herman 
Schelter, Dr. Gregory, the 
staff of the Farwell Convales-
cent Center and the Auxiliary 
staff at the Center. 

LAWN MOWER For sale. See 
at 800 Second in Farwell. 

40-2tc Legal Notice 
I I 

•	 

Now Open In Farwell 

D & M PLUMBING CO. 
109 Ave. A 

K. DRAKE 	M. MARKS 

OWNERS 

See us for all your plumbing 
needs. 

SCHOOL GIRL age 13 would 
like to baby sit day or night. 
Call 481-9277. 	41-1tc. 

MONROESHOCKS 
MAX AIR ADJUSTABLE 

SHOCKS 

P.O. Box 286 
Farwell, Texas 79325 
All persons having claims 

against this Estate which is 
currently being administered 
are required to present them 
within the time and in the 
manner prescribed by law. 

DATED the 16th day of 
June, 1977. 

NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST 

THE ESTATE OF 
G.T. WATKINS, DECEASED 

BRAKE SHOES 
EXCHANGE 

LW 

Mrs. Christa Gohlke and 
children 

801PileSt. 

762-4417 L
tom Kianc 
ENDER 

Notice is hereby given that 
original Letters Testamentary 
for the Estate of G.T. WAT-
KINS were issued on June 14, 
1977, in Cause No. 1396, pend-
ing in the County Court of 
Parmer County, Texas, to: 
DEXTER WATKINS. 

The residence of such Exe-
cutrix is Farwell, Parmer 
County, Texas. The post office 
address is: 

Mrs. Dexter Watkins 
c/o Aldridge, Harding, 

Aycock & Actkinson 
Attorneys at Law 

Clovis, New Mexico 

DRUM TURNING 

ALL WORK 
GUARANTEED 

41-1tc 

FOR SALE -- Good boy's 
shirts and pants. Also 2 suits; 
sizes 11 Slim, 12, and 14 Slim, 
27x30 and 27x32. Call 481-9378. 

41-2tc. 

Every thousand one dollar 
bills cost the government 
$8.02 cents to print. 

ALDRIDGE, HARDING, 
AYCOCK & ACTKINSON 

P.O. Box 286 
Farwell, Texas 79325 

ATTENTION 1 

CATTLEMEN 
in the 

TEXICO-FARWELL AREA: 

NEW 
EQUIPMENT 

L-2 Combine W/20 ft. 
Head 

M-2 Combine W/20 ft. 
Head 

7060 AC Tractor 
7040 AC Tractor 
7000 AC Tractor 
28 Ft. Stubble Mulch Flex- 

King 
21 ft. Offset Disc 
14 ft. Offset Disc 

USED 
EQUIPMENT 

1 - JD 730 Tractor 
1 • 32 ft. Miller Rod 

Weeder 
1 - 45 ft. Flex-King Rod 

Weeder 
AC Model "G" Combine 

17 ft. 

A PLAINS 
EQU I PMENT 

CO. 
1730 WALLACE, 

CLOVIS 

Tour local 
used cow 
dealer is 

friona bi-products 

Seven days a week 

stock removal 

CAL COLLECT 241-3032 

Published in State Line Trib-
une June 24, 1977. 

By: Charles F. Aycock 
Attorney for the Estate 

r 

Ph. 481 - 3380 

INSULATE 
NOW! 

Protect From Summer Heat 
Prepare For Winter Cold 

LEE'S ELECTRIC 
Farwell 4  

1 

TWO MINUTES.% 
I 

	

BY CORNELIUS 	R. SEAM 	PRES. 
MEAN 	BIBLE SOCIETY 

CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 	60635 

YOU DO 

"I 	am the way, the truth and the 
life; no man cometh unto the Father 

but by me" 	(John 14:6i. 	These are 

the words of the Lord Jesus. In writ- 
ing about them years ago, the late 
Pastor J. C. O'Hair said: 

"A Person 	is our Savior and cur 
salvation. A Person is our Life-giver 
andour life. A Person is our Redeemer 
and redemption.A Person is our right- 
eousness and holiness. A Person is 
our peace and our hope. That Person 
is the Lord Jesus 	Christ, 	'the Man 
Christ Jesus,' the 'one Mediator be- 
tween God and men.' By His blood we 
have been brought nigh to God. 

"We need nothing more than Christ; 
nothing less will suffice or avail. To 
add any religion whatsoever to Christ 
Himself 	is 	to 	displease 	God. 	In 

Christ 	are 	hid 	all 	the 	treasures 	of 

wisdom and knowledge. God was in 

Christ 	reconciling 	the 	world 	unto 

Himself. 	The believer 	is 	in Christ. 

The believer 	is complete 	in Christ; 
accepted in Christ. without condem- 
nation 	in Christ. 	the righteousness 

of 	God 	in 	Christ. 	The 	believer 	is 

blessed with all 	spiritual blessings 

in 	Christ. 	Christ 	is 	the 	superlative 

It/M .PIE 	BIBLE 

NEED HIM 

need of the world. 

need, but you do need 
have Him, or be lost 

How wonderful 
offers Himself and 
His 	redemptive 
everywhere. 	no 
sins, no matter what 
Law entered that 
abound," says St. 
sin abounded, grace 
abound...that 	grace 
(Rom. 	5:20,211 
was the living example 
for he was the chief 
by grace through 
says: 

"I was a blaspherner, 
cutor, 	and 	injurious, 
of our Lord was exceeding 

''This 	is a faithful 
thy 	of 	all 	acceptation, 
Jesus came into 
sinners. of whom I 

' But 	for 	this 
mercy, that 	in me 
might show forth 
for 	a 	pattern 	to 
hereafter 	believe 
everlasting" (I Tim. 

, _s_ 
i 

. 

itanaiit Meittatiaf 
iffelitaist Ckacit 

Russell Martin - Pastor 
Church School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Rowel/ Duna 06 allot 
Leonard Harper -Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

Texica 
Fiket Baptiot awl( 

Joel Horne - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 pin. 

He is all that you 
Him. You must 

forever." 
to know that He 
all the merits of 

work 	to 	sinners 
matter 	what 	their 

their past. -The 
the offence might 

Fauttefe 
Riot Baptiet Ckteick 

Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Paul, "but where 
did much more 

might 	reign" 
And 	Paul 	himself 

of this truth, 
of sinners, saved 

faith 	in Christ. He 

flooestlitii 06 Gott 
J. M. Hutson - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:15 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

and a per  se- 
but...the grace 

abundant... 
saying and wor- 

that 	Christ 
the world to save 
am chief. 
cause 	I 	obtained 

	

Sunday Mass 	10 a.m.  

St. Eitmepkto 

Calitatic Ckunck 
Chrysostom Partee - Priest 
Confession - Sunday, 9:30 a.m. 

- 
Christian Doctrine after Mass 

 
first Jesus Christ 
all 	long-suffering, 
those who should 

on 	Him 	to 	life 
1:13-15). 

Kew liglit 
&litho t Cfraltek 

Thomas J. Spikes - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9 45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Services - 6:30 p.m. 

Catuati Baptiot Ckwtek 
Carrell Watkins - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 

Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m 

A 

PLAINS

Morning 

_ 
ilititecl Peidecaotat Dank 

Jim Swank - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:30 p.m. 

r  
W ILLIE ROBERTS 

A 

A 

A \ A  EQUIPMENT amin 
"""°"`""" 

1730 Wallace, 
769-1936 

Sales - 

Clovis- 

CO. 
Service 

CAPITOL FOODS 

Shaine' 
,-1 -  

.0k6aliama Lane 
litelltactiot Ckutick 

Harvey Whittenburg - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - II a.m. 
Evening Worship • 7 p.m. 

509 AVENUE 

i rs  
TEXACO 

 

312 WHEELER 
Ph. 482-9915 

FINA 

- 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON-PITMAN, 

INC. Okfaltema hue 
Baptiot Cluottk 

Moody Smith - Pastor 

....,.: Worley 
.4. 

J....0. 

.164 .7 tie. 

.,... 

FARWELL FINA 
Ph. 481-9917 

Carrell Watkins 

The 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

CITIZENS BANK 
Texico Branch 

Complete Bank Service 
Member FDIC 

WS Cusp 

Baptiot Ckwt.ck 
'Lewis Johnson - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

, 

TEXACO 
'INC.  

Woodrow Lovelace 

/HOLIDAY/ 
St, 9akitto 

A/Stoup L..luacIt 
Herman J. Schelter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship . 10:30 a.m. 

5th & Ave. A 	- 	481-9070 

ROSE DRUG 

P GIFT SHOP 

Prescriptions a Specialty 
481-3281 

OKLAHOMA LANE 

FARM SUPPLY A 

"Where Your Business 
Is Appreciated" 

- 

WATTS 

Machine and Pump 
Layne Bowler Pumps and 
Repair • Gearhead Repair 
Ph. 481-3239 - Farwell, Tex. 

fatiat 
Ckulta 06 Cititiot 

Hal L. Howell - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

AUTO
402 3rd 

-FIRE 

ALDRIDGE 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
-CASUALTY 

Ph. 481-3361 

;; Ia. PIK 
of Farwell 

_ 

Religious Music All 
Day Sunday On 

KZOL 

1570 On Your Dial 

PEeaoaxt Riff 

&Plot Citwtelt 
sRuicnkdaPyasrckheoon P_ a9st3o0ra.m.  

Morning Worship 10:30 a.m. .
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

i 

Tire Co 

JOHN DEERE 
	

NEW 
EQUIPMENT 

I - JD 4430 Dsl. ('ab, Air, 
Heat. 

JD2280 Windpower Cab, 
Air. 

JD8630 Tractor, Cab, Air 
Posture Seats, Duals. 

4630's, Cab, Air, Posture 
Seat. Duals, Power Shift 
or Quad Range. 

4430's, Cab, Air, Posture 
Seat, Duals, Power Shift 
or Quad Range. 

USED EQUIPMENT 
1 - JD 4430, Quad Range, 

Loaded 
- JD 4630, Loaded 

- JD 4320, Cab, Air, 
heat. Reconditioned. 

Several good chisel plows 
various sizes. 

',WE TRADE" 

CAL JORDAN 
IMPLEMENTS 

Ph. 163.5517 
East Mabry Drive 

Clovis, N.M. 

NEW EQUIPMENT 

Woods 4 Row Shredders 

Ferguson Tilrovators 

ParkHurst Grain Trailer 

14' King Offset [22" 
Blades) 

Hamby Chisel Plow - 
Row 

Cisco Chisel Plow - 6 Row 
MM 880 HD Power Units 
L.B.I. Drag Bars 

8800 White Diesel Cab, 
Air, Heater, Monitor, 
Flotation Tires, Hydro, 
Quick Switch 22' Plat-
form, Pickup Reel 

USED EQUIPMENT 
Caldwell 4 Row Shredders 

12' Miller Offset 

1973 J.D. 1430, Power 
Shift, Cab, Air, Radio 
Duals. 

1974 J.D. 4430 Quad-Range 
Cab, Radio, Air, Duals. 

14' Shaeffer offset 26" 
blades [excellent condi- 
tion) 

1972 MF 1150 Tractor 

JD - 14 ft. 210 Double 
10 offset 

FARWELL 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

Ph. 481.3212 
Farwell, Ix. 



• 

p 

k. 

RECYCLING 

We Provide... 
Complete 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXIGE--, -- 
Buyers of Fat, Bones, Restaurant-Gse and Hides 

RS, FARMERS 
T OPERATORS 
MUNITY SERVICE 

nitary Service 
ton 

763-5513 

Call Collect 
763-5513 

State Line Tribune, Friday, June 24, 1977-Page 7 
to the proceeding unless they 
comply with Rules 129.03.13.001-
.003 which require actual 
presence at the hearing. 
Persons desiring further infor-
mation in connection with this 
application or the administra-
tive procedures to be followed 
may contact Ryan Petty, P.O. 
Box 13207, Austin, Texas 78711, 
Telephone (512) 475-2711. 

/s/ Joe D. Carter 
Joe D. Carter, Chairman 
TEXAS WATER RIGHTS 

COMMISSION 

Date: June 7, 1977 

This notice is published at the 
expense of the applicant and 
not the State of Texas. 

Published in the State Line 
Tribune June 24 and July 1, 
1977. 

(3) Reservoir No. 3 will 
have a capacity of five 
acre-feet with the midpoint 
of the dam at the stream 
located N 31° W, 6500 feet 
from said survey corner; 
and 
(4) Reservoir No. 4 will 
have a capacity of 15 acre-
feet with the midpoint of 
the dam at the stream lo-
cated N 18° W, 6600 feet 
from said survey corner. 

Applicant seeks authority to 
divert and use not to exceed 
800 acre-feet of water per 
annum from Reservoir No. 4 
to irrigate 600 acres of land in 
said survey, 21 miles NE of 
Farwell, Texas, Reservoir 
Nos. 1, 2 and 3 will capture 
and retain for reuse the tail-
waters produced by ground-
water irrigation from the ap-
plicant's system, which 
groundwater will be released 
as needed by gravity, thence 
via unnamed tributaries of 
Running Water Draw where it 
will be recaptured for use 
from Reservoir No. 4. 

Applicant seeks authority to 
divert water by means of one 
stationary pump located at a 
point N 23° W, 6400 feet from 
said survey corner at a 
maximum rate of 1.3 cfs (600 
gpm), all being more fully set 
out in the application. 

Application No. 3771 was ac-
cepted for filing pursuant to 
§5.121, Texas Water Code, and 
Rules 129.02.05.001 through 
129.02.70.008, on June 6, 1977, 
and a hearing thereon will be 
held by the Commission in the 
Stephen F. Austin State Office 
Building at 1700 N. Congress 
Avenue in Austin, Texas, on 
July 27, 1977, at 10 o'clock 
a.m. Those opposing the 
granting of said application 
may appear at the hearing 
and/or, at least five days 
before the hearing date, may 
file written protests with the 
Commission and serve copies 
on the applicant by certified 
mail, return receipt requested, 
or by attorney's affidavit. 
Written protests must contain 
the name and address of the 
applicant, an allegation of 
potential injury of the protest-
ant, the basis of protestant's 
claim of right and the location 
of protestant's diversion, if 
applicable, and any possible 
adjustments to the application 
which would result in a with-
drawal of the protest. How-
ever, persons filing such 
written protests are not en-
titled to be admitted as parties 

Train 
Derails 

Here 

A Santa Fe freight train bound for Lubbock derailed from 
tracks behind the Golden West Seed Company in Texico last 
Thursday morning. Two of the empty cars completely left the 
tracks and two other cars buckled the rails further down the 
lines. There were no injuries in the accident. A valve blew 
open resulting in a broken line on one of the box cars, which 
caused the derailment, according to the Santa Fe agent. 

17. 2ND PRIZE: 24 BLACK & WHITE PERSONAL-SIZE PORTABLE TV'S E 3RD PRIZE: 48 10-SPEED BICYCLES 
❑ 4TH PRIZE: 48 ELECTRONIC N GAMES E 5Th PRIZE: 288 TIMEX WATCHES 16TH PRIZE 130 iciloo®LITTLE 
PLAYMATE COOLERS LI 7TH PRIZE: 1200 CAROUEST BASEBALL CAPS. 

5" and 10" locking 
pliers with curved 
jaws. built-in wire 
cutter, release lever, 
NATIONALLY 
ADVERTISED 

Sug List S9.95 

ONLY 

Make oil 8 filter changes, lube 
lobs easy No jack needed. 
4500-lb capacity/pr. 

CAROUEST RAINCHECK POLICY. Every CAROUEST Special is a bona fide offer. If we run out of an advertised item or fail to receive the 
merchandise, we will issue a "Raincheck" entitling you to the sale price. Rainchecks do not apply to items staled as being in limited supply. 

These Specials_ plus many additional savings are in CAROUEST s Sweepstakes brochure Savings good at CAROUEST Auto Parts Stores thru July 4 1977 

jour 
BANKAMERICARD 

welcome hew 

.7naliatta Twin City Youths To Enlist In Navy 
the upcoming ceremonies, en-
listed in the Navy May 31 and 
is presently attending boot 
camp. 

These young men will un-
dergo recruit training at the 
Naval Training Center in San 
Diego, Calif., as the "Golden 
Plains Company." 

The Navy Recruiting Dis-
trict, Albuquerque, will enlist 
approximately 75 young men 
from West Texas and eastern 
New Mexico in the U.S. Navy 
Saturday, June 25, at 10 a.m. 
CDT at the Civic Center ih 
Amarillo. 

Among the new recruits will 
be Doyle Goldsmith Jr., son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Gold-
smith Sr., of Farwell; Rudolph 
Sanchez, Jr., son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Rudolph Sanchez Sr., of 
Texico; and Ray F. Zachrel, 
son of Mrs. Anita Zachrel of 
Texico. 

Bill Holley, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Holley of Texico, 
who was also to participate in 

The immediate past Deputy 
Commander, Navy Recruiting 
Command, Rear Admiral Rob-

'ert W. Watkins, USN, now 
Executive Director of the 
Defense Logistics Agency, will 
be the guest speaker and will 
administer the oath of enlist-
ment. 

HARDWARE STORE 

BEAT THE HEAT 
SPECIALS 

	1 Legal Notice 
SPECIALS GOOD MON JUNE 20 Through JUNE 25! 

tary White River, tributary 
Salt Fork Brazos River, tribu-
tary Brazos River, Brazos 
River Basin, at the following 
locations in the Abner Taylor 
Survey, Abstract No. 85, 
Parmer County, and to im-
pound therein not to exceed 
the following amounts of 
water: 

NOTICE OF HEARING 
BEFORE THE TEXAS 

WATER RIGHTS 
COMMISSION OF AN 

APPLICATION TO 
APPROPRIATE PUBLIC 

WATERS OF THE 
STATE OF TEXAS 

No. 3771 

Want To Live Without 
Crabgrass? It's Easy! 
Simoly Spread 

You Can Make Dan-
delions, Chickweed, 
Clover and Many Other 
Similar Lawn Weeds 
Curl Up and Disappear. 
How? Simply Spread 

Si 
 

Scotts Clout if %` 
Kansel Gout 

controls 
summer crabgrass 

also green and yekrwr 
krclaiLytung 

veal:hp-a barn, 

such as dallisgras. 

On your lawn. Two 
applications one week 
apart will make this 
ugly stuff curl up and 
disappear — COM-
PLETELY. Clout also 
clears out some of the 
crabgrass "look-alikes" 
like foxtail, witchgrass 
and barnyard grass. 
Yet, it's kind to your 
good grass, so it can fill 
in where the crabgrass 
used to be. 

Scotts Kansel Notice is given that 
FLAGG FERTILIZER AND 

CHEMICAL COMPANY 
c/o Mr. Fred Kuntz, 

President 
Route 4, Box 42A 
Dimmitt, Texas 79027 

applicant, seeks a permit to 
construct and maintain four 
dams and reservoirs, known 
as Reservoir Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 
4, on unnamed tributaries of 
Running Water Draw and 
Running Water Draw, tribu- 

control,. darxklions., 
buck horn. 

chicklmcvd, km:Ant-4Ni, 
plantain,nhite firmer 

and other weeds 

(1) Reservoir No. 1 will 
have a capacity of five 
acre-feet with the midpoint 
of the dam at the stream 
located N 46° W, 9300 feet 
from the SE corner of the 
aforesaid survey; 
(2) Reservoir No. 2 will 
have a capacity of five 
acre-feet with the midpoint 
of the dam at the stream 
located N 37° W,7200 feet 
from the aforesaid survey 
corner; 

It gets rid of the ROOTS 
AND ALL — so they 
can't grow back. Now's 
a perfect time to spread 
Scotts Kansel, while the 
weeds are actively 
growing. This week end 
would be great! 

An Italian astronomer named 
Damascene once concluded 
that people who laugh with 
the sound "A" (ha-ha) are 
cool and composed and 
people who laugh with 
the sound "o" (ho-hol are 
cheerful and confident 

Group 7 by Purolator 

39  Air Filters 
REG. 1.89 	

 

BE A WINNER IN THE FIRST IN• 
• 111 • 

II • 	• • 
• • II MI • 11 

Group 7 by Purolator  

REG. 1.49 	

119 Oil Filters CARQUEST NATIONAL 
SWEEPSTAKES TST. 3-WAY PLUS 

HOLDING TANK CHEMICAL Masking Tape 

396  
• CLEANER • DEODORIZER • DISINFECTANT 
• ECONOMICAL ... approximately 15 treatments 

per quart Plastic container. 
3 4" x 60 Yards 

R EG. 69c 	 388 GALLON 
REG. 6.06 	  

104  Electrical Tape R EG. 19c 
2" x 150' 

288  
1 /2  GALLON 
REG. 3.75 	 

Wide Reflective Tape REG( 31560  — • 	 9 84  QUART 	
1 88  REG. 2.25. 	  

1974 & 1976 INDY 500 WINNER Cool Cushions 
1 88 

Gerber R. V. 10" 

COMMODE GRAND PRIZE • • —0 
Protects car seats from 
ummer heat No. 600116 
REG. 2.29 

Heavy duty construction with heavy glazed 
finish. Maximum water area in howl...exceeds 
9" x 8". Oversize trapway and quiet, dependable 
siphon-Jet flushing action. Plastic bolt caps. 
Easily installed. 10" rough-in (determined by 
measuring from wall to center of drain). 
Complete with seat. White Only. 

YOUR CHOICE: A BRAND NEW 1977 CHRYSLER CORDOBA 
OR A 1977 DODGE TRADESMAN B100 VAN COMPLETE WITH A 
$1000 ACCESSORY PACKAGE. DELIVERED IN PERSON BY JOHNNY 
RUTHERFORD. REGISTRATIONS CLOSE JULY 4, 1977. 

For details. pick up a Sweepstakes Savings 

brochure at participating CARQUEST Auto Parts Stores. Jack Stands 
388 

• I 

n Pairs - Holds up to 
000 Lbs. - NO. 7224 
EG. 4.29 65" No. 37997 

REG, 75.64 	 FREON 
RECHARGE KIT 

PORTABLE 
CAR RAMPS 

VISE-GRIP'® 
GIFT SET 

TWO-DRAWER 
TOOL CHEST Wiss Metal 19" SERVESS Angelo Hanging 

LAWN MOWER Cutting 

Snips 
NO. A-9 

REG. 7.85 

688 

15 oz. Freon, lock valve 
clamps. charge line 
with safety 
check, 
dispensing 
valve. 
instructions. 
$8.00 Value 

ONLY 

Floral 

Hooks 

Chest storage, tool box portability, 
extra storage in till. Drawers 
lock when lid is closed. 
20 —x81/2 "x1 0" 
high. Drawers. 
13/4 " deep. 

Powerful 3 -ho engine with recoil 

start; remote control throttle on 

handle Sturdy 14.ga. steel deck; 

washout port for easy cleaning. 3 

cutting heights. Air-lift tip aus-

tempered blade. 

Sug. List S27.75 

ONLY REG.
N-40-197 6 499  
74.99 

VANONT 
JUTE 

4-5 & 	PLY 

NATURAL 
COLOR 

10 LB BALL 

REG. 6.99 
99 

Will hold up 
to 50 Lbs. 

$5.99 	$19.99 pr 	$7.49 $19.95 

9 REG. 
98c 

awe Hughes Auto 
Farwell 

Ph 481-9083 

TRUE VALUES EVERY DAY 

5th & Mitchell Clovis 762-2906 AT MOST LOOM IONS 

"WE KNOW WHAT YOU MEAN WHEN YOU'RE TALKING PARTS" 
SF • 



NOW? 
Orders received by 

Higromatic during the summer 
months allow us to maintain an 
efficient production level during a 
seasonally slow period. This 
continued efficiency creates savings 
that Higromatic will share with you 
during our Summer Cash Bash 
(June-August). 

Buy any Higromaticn' 
irrigation system during the summer 
months and receive a Cash Bash 
savings direct from Fligromatic of 
$1.56 per foot on the total length of 
your machine. On a standard 
quarter section irrigator (1285 ft.) 
this is over a $2000 savings to you. 
All machines purchased under this 
special offer will be shipped at 
Higromatic's discretion. 

•On price of 1285 ft. machine 
"Dependent on flow rates and 

end-gun selection. 

Placing an order now is to 
your advantage. This will insure 
that you get today's machine prices 
and there will be more time to plan 
your installation before the growing 
season. If you buy a quarter section 
machine, the $2000 Cash Bash 
savings should take care of your 
interest well into the 1978 crop 
season. 

Higromatic offers the 
most complete line of pivotal 
irrigation systems in the industry. 
The full-size machines cover 130 -1-
acres and are offered in Electric 
and Water Drive units. A modified 
Warren Truss design gives your 
irrigator maximum strength with 
minimum weight. Higromatic's 
unique freestanding pivot allows 
you to build your pivot pad with 1:2 
to 1/3 the concrete usually required. 

The highly portable line 
of Fieldhopperm' irrigators are 
available in one, two, and three 
tower systems irrigating from 6-50" 
acres per circle. A trailer-type 
pivot option (pictured) makes this 
line very versatile. 

All Higromatic irrigators 
are constructed with exceptionally 
high quality parts and a wide variety 
of options are available to meet 
your field requirements. 

At participating dealers 

• 

a 

fhtPIZZAIL. 11am - 2pm 5pm - 10pm 
-OPEN DAILY-

Friday & Saturday 
11am - 11pm 

Sunday 
2pm - 10pm 

PHONE 762-9990 
or 762-5705 
FOR TAKE OUTS 

10th & Sycamore 
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by Shirley Gorman 

Avis Patterson and Lorene 
Mills, Texico elementary tea-
chers, retired this year after 
being in the school system 26 
and 11 years, respectively. 

Mrs. Patterson began her 
first teaching assignment in 
1951 at Texico -- the year 
Texico and Pleasant Hills 
schools consolidated. Her first 
group was a combined fourth 
and fifth grade class number-
ing 58 students. She com-
mented that the children 
presented no problems at all 
"They had an advantage," she 
says, "in that they were able 
to work on their assignments 
while I taught the other 
gi•ades a lesson." 

During the years she taught 
at Texico, Mrs. Patterson 

Retiring Texico Teachers 
During Texico High School's graduation exercises May 20 
members of the school board presented special plaques to 
Mrs. Avis Patterson, left, and Mrs. Lorene Mills, who retired 
this year as Texico elementary teachers. A faculty tea was 
held in their honor May 13. Mrs. Patterson has taught for 26 
years in Texico and Mrs. Mills served 11 years as a Texico 
teacher. 

lived in town for 17 years 
before moving to Clovis. She 
has witnessed many changes 
in the school system. New 
buildings have been added and 
in general the schools have 
grown. At one time she says 
the lunch room, junior high 
and elementary were all 
housed in one building. 

Mrs. Patterson remarked 
that in 23 out of her 26 years 
at Texico she has always 
taught at least one child who 
was related to an Autrey. She 
says she always tried to teach 
each student as an unique 
individual deserving of love 
and respect. And she readily 
admits that "yes, I would do it 
all over again." 

Mrs. Patterson grew up in 
an era where women were 
either teachers or nurses. As 

her mother and other close 
relatives were teachers, it was 
a natural choice to follow in 
their footsteps. 

She attended classes in 
Parish Junior College for two 
years before accepting her 
first position at a small school 
in Red River County, Texas. 
"At that time," she explains, 
"it was possible to teach with 
only two years of college." 

The school at Oak Ridge 
consisted of two teachers. 
Mrs. Patterson taught grades 
five through eight and because 
she was the "higher grades 
teacher" she was also chosen 
as principal, in spite of the 
fact that it was her first year 
on the job." 

Mrs. Patterson has devoted 
her life to teaching. She began 
attending summer classes un-
til she earned her full degree 
in 1950 at East Texas State 
University. In addition to 
teaching, she kept busy rear-
ing two children. Bobby Pat-
terson is employed by the 
Department of Defense in 
Washington, D.C., and Pa-
tricia Bingham lives in Rui-
doso, N.M. 

Mrs. Patterson has observed 
many changes in the teaching 
profession, noting that em-
phasizing the importance of 
phonics has vacillated and for 
a time the basics in mathe-
matics gave way to the new 
math approach. Now she says 
she is glad to note that equal 
importance is once again 
being placed on the basics in 
math, adding "she never 
really left them." 

Even though Mrs. Patterson 
is looking forward to her 
retirement, she says she will 
miss teaching, especially spell-
ing and math -- her favorite 
subjects. 

STEED — TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

-When Understanding Is Needed Most" 

Prince & Manana-Clovis-Ph. 763-5541 

Texico-Farwell 

Lions Club 
Meets 2nd and 4th 

Mondays 

CLARA'S SPUR 
RESTAURANT 

Lorene Mills taught the 
second and third grades at 
Texico for nine years. She 
first came to the school 
system in 1966. Mrs. Mills's 
husband, Vernon, was the 
superintendent of Clovis 
Schools and it was not per-
mitted for her to teach in the 
same district. 

Noting educational changes, 
Mrs. Mills said more subjects 
are being taught now, empha-
sizing that the basics in math 
are being stressed once again. 

She loves to work with 
children and to observe the 
progress they make. Her 
favorite students are third 
graders "because they are 
mature enough to work on 
their own, but are still quite 
manageable." 
, The retired teacher was 
born in Curry County and 
lived in Artesia, N.M. for 18 
years before moving to Clovis. 
She obtained her degree 
through Eastern New Mexico 
University and has been 
involved with the teaching 
profession for 19 years. 

There were a few breaks in 
between allowing time to rear 
a family of four. Sidney Mills 
teaches in Albuquerque: Jack-
ie Hodges is a librarian at 
Ranchvale School; Pam Baum 

ILJI • 
Grady Hwy. 	IRRIGATION PIPE CO. 
Box 1931  A 1.1.S.INIDUSTRIES COMPANY_ 

And that makes a world of difference. 

WYSS Clovis, 
New Mexico 
JOE CAMP 

762-7751 
Res. 

762-5605 
a 

Food King Of. 

SALAD 

GREAT 	Crisco 

3r. caEnSSING 
59' 

SAVNGS SHORTENING 4'69  
Rich and Ready Gallon 

ORANGE DRINK 79' 
Golden West 25 Lb. Bag 	FLOUR $2.89 
King Size 	 CHEER $1.95 
Keebler 12 Oz. Box Vanilla 	WAFERS 	49° 
Food King No. 303 Sweet PEAS 	511.00 
Food King No. 303 Cat GREEN BEANS511.00 
Food King No. 303 WIK CORN 	4/1.00 
Van Camps No. 303 PORK. BEANS 411.00 

,_„,,, 	PLUMS Calif. Red Beauly 	Lb.  59t 
FRESH 

ttz 
*; - 	APRICOTS Calif. Fancy 	Lb. 590  

ilk 

PRODUCE 
for 

summer 

4  
P 

,. 	.<, 
TOMATOES Vine  301.00 Tex"ip e R 

' (11-1— 	POTATOES 'z-740-  
Calif.Bag 	79°Long White 

9 Oz. 	 COOL WHIP 59' 
Minute Maid Big 12 Oz. Can 	ORANGE JUICE sr 
Morton 9 Oz. Glazed 

Bordens Sq. Half Gallon ICE CREAM 	89' 
Gooch Sliced Slab 	 BACON th. $1.09 
Boneless Brisket 	 ROAST lb. 89' 
U.S.D.A. "Grade A" 	 FRYERS Lb. 49' 
Boneless Arm Swiss 	 STEAK Lb. 89' 

AffillATED 
WE GIVE 

CAPITOL 
DOUBLE STAMPS 

FOODS _ 
WE GIVE 

FEATURE 
SHURFRESH 

MILK 
FARWELL 

BLUE  CLOVIS 

STAMPS 

OPEN OPEN 

We 

Ill 
Redeem 

ON WEDNESDAY 

9 O'CLOCK 
U.S.D.A. Food 

EVERY 
Stamps 

NIGHT: 	 
L,_„,,,,,_5  STAMPS . 

wE  

FEATURE 

TENMCDRUST 

Texico Elementary Teachers Retire After Many Years 
is a housewife; and Rodney 
Mills is attending college at 
Albuquerque. 

Mrs. Mills has always found 
time to do some sewing and 
crocheting and even has 
decoupaged a few pictures .  
She has no special plans for 
retirement, but does intend to 
travel with her husband. 

The world's largest stadium, 
the 200,000-seat Maracana 
Stadium in Rio de Janeiro, 
has a nine-foot-wide moat to 
protect referees and teams 
from enraged sports fans. 
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