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I need 

your help 

Neighborhood Watch 
meeting scheduled 

The parents of the players were 
recognized and given flowers and 
basketballs. 

The Farwell Homecoming king and 
queen were announced Feb. 11 at 
the Kress game. The king was Jesse 
Anzaldua and queen Shonda Foster. 

Here's what a 
Watch program 
is all about 

Candidacies accepted 

for Farwell mayor 
The resignation of Walter Kalt-

wasser as Farwell mayor, effective 
April 5, was accepted at Monday's 
City Council meeting. 

April 5 is the date for the city 
election. Kaltwasser, who retired 
from farming last year, has been 
dividing his time between his Far-
wel home and a place he owns in 
Colorado. 

Kaltwasser was first elected 
mayor in 1977 and has served in that 
post until the present. 

Persons who would like to file for 
the mayoral post can do so at City 
Hall until Feb. 19, the filing dead-
line. 

However, the council will not 
decide until its March 10 meeting 
whether the mayoral post will be on 
the April 5 ballot. 

Currently, the ballot will have 
three spots on it, all for city council. 

The posts currently held by Eliza-
beth Phillips, Martin Kube and Fred 
Chandler, are on the ballot. 

The council has two options: 
--It can place the mayoral post on 

the ballot. 
--It can choose one of its own 

councilmen to serve as mayor until 
that term ends, in 1987. 

The council is worried that if it 
places the mayoral post on the 
ballot and no one files for it, then a 
person getting just one write-in vote 
could be elected mayor. So the 
councilmen are going to check with 
local persons who would be eligible 
to serve as mayor to see if they 
would like to file by Feb. 19. 

If no one files by Feb. 19, it is 
likely that the council will take the 
second option -- choose one of its 
own to fill the unexpired mayoral 
term. 

Farwell to have mural 
The Farwell City Council decided 

Monday to have a mural painted on 
the side of City Hall as a Texas 
Sesquicentennial project. 

The cost will be about $3,600, for 
material and labor. 

The council is accepting donations 
for the work. 

To get the project under way, the 
council voted $400 in advance 
money for Clovis artist Cherokee, 
who was commissioned to do the 

project. What the mural will look 
like still hasn't been decided. 

The mural will be 10 feet by 52 feet 
and painted on wooden panels to be 
hung on the City Hall wall. Then, 
after a period, will be moved to the 
inside of the Farwell Community 
Center. 

The work is expected to take 
about a month once the final draw-
ing is agreed upon. 

Watch Program. We're seeing.... 
positive results with Watch Pro-
grams all over the country, from 
Seattle to Las Vegas to Jackson, 
Mississippi. And what we're really 
witnessing is a reaffirmation of 
American values. A sense of com-
munity and fellowship, individual 
responsibility, caring for family and 
friends, and a respect for the law." 

Attorney General William French 
Smith announced, "Another import-
ant factor in the drop in crime is the 
increased vigilance of the individual 
citizen acting within his or her 
neighborhood or community in such 
groups as Neighborhood Watch or 
community crime prevention 
groups. As each person becomes 
more actively involved in protecting 
his neighbor's rights and property; 
we take another step forward at the 
grass-roots level in developing ef-
fective programs to fight crime." 

The purpose of Neighborhood 
Watch is to make you aware of the 
steps you can take to make your 
home more secure against crime, to 
show how you and your neighbors 
can help each other protect your 
entire neighborhood, and to make 
your local law enforcement agency 
more effective in its fight against 
crime through your involvement 
and participation. 

A Neighborhood Watch project is 
the logical first step for any com-
munity organizing against crime; it 
requires minimal effort and gets 
people talking to and caring about 
one another. 

Frances Kube provided this in-
formation about what a Neighbor-
hood Watch program is about: 

The Neighborhood Watch pro-
gram was initiated in the City of 
Farwell in 1983 by the Farwell 
Development Corporation. Window 
stickers and metal highway signs. 
were purchased from the group's 
treasury, and the stickers were 
distributed free of charge to resi-
dents for display on their homes, as 
are the ones you will find enclosed. 
The program was set up with a 
captain or chairman for each block 
in the city. It was hoped that there 
would be block meetings and block 
parties so that neighbors would get 
to know one another better. 

National Neighborhood Watch is a 
program sponsored by the National 
Sheriff's Association, and supported 
by local law enforcement agencies 
to reduce crime, and to make 
America's neighborhoods safer 
places to live and play. 

Law enforcement officers cannot 
significantly impact crimes of op-
portunity, such as residential burg-
lary and vandalism, without help 
from the citizens. By taking steps to 
protect their persons, homes and 
property, watching over that of 
their neighbors and reporting 
suspicious and criminal activity, 
citizens can help their law enforce-
ment agencies effectively reduce 
neighborhood crime. This is what 
Neighborhood Watch is all about. 

President Reagan has said, "Let 
me commend the Neighborhood 

Folks, today's column is an im-
portant one for you to read since I 
need some help from our longtime 
residents. And even if you weren't 
around 60 years ago, perhaps you 
have a relative who was. 

Here's the situation: 
Coming up in September will be 

the State Line Tribune's Diamond 
Jubilee — our 75th Anniversary. We 
plan to make the Sept. 5 issue really 
special. 

For example, it will center around 
an oral history of the Twin Cities: 
we will reproduce many of the 
features we've been running on 
longtime area residents. 

We've also contacted9ocal his-
torians who will be helping. Don 
MacAlvay came by the office last 
week with a couple of really in-
teresting articles about the good, 
old days. And Hugh Mosely stopped 
by with information about the news-
paper's founders, the B.F. Fears 
family. 

Last week, I met with Abie Crume 
(the former Allie Blanche, daughter 
of Hop Graham) in Hereford. She 
will be writing a special article 
about her tenure working at the 
Tribune in the 1930s when she was 
the first female linotype operator in 
the whole area. 

In addition, Harold Carpenter of 
Oklahoma Lane will be providing us 
with a history of that important 
area, and John Getz will be writing 
about his years of ownership. 

Soi believe we have made a good 
start at compiling information for 
this special commemorative issue. 
Now for the problem: 

Back in 1940, a fellow working at 
the Tribune was told to burn some 
old papers. Inadvertantly, he 
burned all the papers ever printed 
until that point. So there is virtually 
no history of the Tribune available 
before 1940. 

Looking around the Tribune of-
fice, I have been able to find eight 
copies of the Tribune, Texico 
Trumpet and Farwell Times be-
tween 1907 and 1923. That's it. 

So question No. 1: If you have any 
copies of the Tribune before 1940, I'd 
like to borrow them so I can re-
produce them in our special issue. 
This would show how the newspaper 
has changed over the years. 

In checking into the ownership of 
the Tribune over the 75 years, here 
is what I have found: 

1911 - 1922 B.F. Fears. 
1922-23 — Autry brothers. 
1923-24 -- R.B Boyle. 
1914-26 Stanley Sigler. 
1926-1965 -- Graham Family (Hop 

and Sonny). 
1965-1984 — John Getz. 
1984 - Present — Mike Pomper. 
Question No. 2: We have infor-

mation on Fears, Graham, Getz and 
Pomper. But we have no infor-
mation on Autry, Boyle and Sigler. 
If you recall anything about any of 
those three owners -- Autry, Boyle 
or Sigler -- we'd appreciate it if you 
could send that information to us: 
State Line Tribune, Box 255, Far-
well, Texas, 79325. 

Mrs. Crume recalled that the 
Siglers came from Oklahoma and 
had a large family, but that's about 
all she could remember. 

We're hoping that some longtime 
residents reading this column might 
recall some of those folks or persons 
who are their descendants. And if 
you don't want to take the time to 
write, just call me at 806/481-3681. 

I'm curious, for example, if the 
"Autry Brothers" are related to 
some of the Autrey's in Texico. And 
who was R.B. Boyle? 

Nothing like a good mystery, I 
say. 

It was fun meeting with Mrs. 
Crume last week. She is married to 
Vance 4-,:Kater" Crume, whose late 
brother Paul was a famous column-
ist for the Dallas Morning News. 
The Crumes are now retired. 

Mrs. Crume remembered the only 
special edition ever put out by the 
Tribune -- back in 1927 for the in-
famous Hassell murder trial. She 
was sent out hawking the papers on 
the streets of Farwell. A copy cost 
5 cents. 

She recalled that the original 
Tribune office was in the Haynes 
Grocery building at Second Street 
and Ave. C. It was moved to its 
present site by Hop Graham when 
he bought the paper because he was 
installing 'linotype machines back 
then and the first building's floor 
wasn't strong enough to support 
them. So Graham made a deal with 
the Capital Freehold Land Trust to 

( Continued on Page 2) 

checked into. 
--Agreed to get a new typewriter 

for City Hall. 
--Heard a resident complain that 

city employees' vehicle had 
trampled his garden and other con-
cerns that he had. The council will 
check into it. 

--Heard a resident request that a 
portion of city property be deeded to 
her. Her fence is in a 30-foot alley 
city easement. Due to legal ques-
tions, an attorney will be checked 
with before a decision is made. 

Present were councilmen Fred 
Chandler, Elizabeth Phillips, 
Martin Kube and Ysleta Kittrell. 
Absent were Mayor Walter Kalt-
wasser and Councilman Curtis 
Smith. 

housing, business and industry were 
needed in the community. South-
western Public Service will provide 
some assistance in the question-
naire preparation. 

--Approved a rate increase for 
SPS, a necessary procedure. An 
example of the hike would be for 100 
kilowatt hours for a residence: the 
current $11.67 cost goes to $12.04. 
Due to state rules, all electric 
adjustments must be made in the 
form of requests to governmental 
units. 

--Received one bid to audit the 
city's books, from De'Aun Willough-
by, of Melrose, N.M. It was awarded 
for $5,500, to audit three years. 

--Discussed buying a new or used 
backhoe for city work. It will be 

Frances Kube and Peggy Sud-
derth, co-chairmen of the Farwell 
Neighborhood Watch program, an-
nounced at Monday's City Council 
meeting that a citywide meeting to 
discuss reactivation of the Watch 
program has been scheduled for 7 
p.m. March 4 at the Farwell Com-
munity Center. 

Interest in reactivating the Watch 
program developed after a Farwell 
resident, Colleen Stover, attended a 
City Council meeting late last year 
to seek a solution to what she said 
was increasing crime in the com-
munity. Her home had been bur-
glarized. 

Mrs. Kube said a questionnaire is 
being sent to Farwell residents 
explaining what the Watch program 
is about and asking them to respond 
to four questions: 

1. Do you feel this letter of 
information and enclosed Neigh-
borhood Watch decals (two are 
being sent with each letter) are 
sufficient at this time? 

2. Would you like to see each block 
have a block captain? 

3. Would you like to have a block 
meeting and would you attend? 

4. If asked, would you be willing to 
serve as block captain? If yes, 
please sign. 

Mrs. Kube also said that the 
Farwell Development Corp., which 
helped sponsor the Watch program 
when it began several years ago, 
has agreed to be a sponsor again. 
This means that it will pay for new 
window decals and for eight new 
metal signs to be placed on city 
streets. 

Mrs. Kube said she has talked 
with Texico people about a Watch 
program and they may participate 
in the March 4 meeting. 

Among the participants at the 
program will be Parmer County 
Sheriff Bill Morgan, Texico City 
Marshal Fred Hamner, Parmer 
County District Attorney Johnny 
Actkinson and Curry County Dis-
trict Attorney. 

Also, Clovis Police Officer Becky 
Raulie will show a film about the 
Watch program. 

At her request, the council agreed 
to have city employees install the 
street signs and also to pay the cost 
for using the Community Center for 
the meeting. 

In other business, the council: 
--Heard City Clerk Janie Bowery 

and Councilman Ysleta Kittrell say 
they were working on a question-
naire to be sent to Farwell residents 
to get their views on whether more 

11 inches of snow reported 
After a near-record of 52 days 

without precipitation, the skies 
opened on the Twin Cities last week. 

Fred Chandler of Sherley-Ander-
son-Pitman reported a total of 11 
inches of snow cascaded from the 
skies Wednesday through Sunday of 
last week. 

The moisture was sorely needed 
by area farmers who had been 
watching their soil turn into a con-
crete-like substance. 

On the first day, Feb. 5, about two 
inches of snow fell. There was no 
precipitation on Feb. 6, then the 
snow began falling in earnest on 
Feb. 7. 

The overall moisture content 
ranged from an estimated four-
tenths at Lariat to about one inch in 
Farwell. 

In Texico, Walter Curd reported 8 
inches of snow. 

The snow and its resultant drifts 

Snowman-maker 
Pictured with his creation is Leo 
Gonzalez, of Farwell. 

Supper, lodging and feed for 
horses costs 75 cents to $1 

caused difficult road conditions, es-
pecially on the highway to Amarillo. 

Both Farwell and Texico schools 
were closed Monday. 

Chamber banquet on tap 
The Farwell Chamber of Com-

merce's annual banquet will be Feb. 
15 at 7:30 p.m. at the Farwell 
Community Center. 

Tickets will be available at the 
door. 

J.Q. Warnick Jr., magistrate for 
the U S. District Court in Lubbock, 
will be the guest speaker. He is 
considered an excellent speaker on 
the subject of crime prevention. 

He has served as a member of the 
Texas Drug Abuse Prevention Ad-
visory Council. 

In addition to the guest speaker, 
the Man of the Year and Woman of 
the Year awards will be presented. 
Last year's recipients Frances 
Kube and Benny Haney. 

Walter Hughes and his crew will 
serve barbequed beef and sausage, 
plus the trimmings. 

Contributions received 
It was announced at Monday's 

meeting of the Texico Chamber of 
Commerce that two more contri-
butions for the Christmas ornament 
project have been received -- from 
Rip's Western Wear and Doyal 
LaRue. 

The Chamber has been collecting 
donations for the lights. If you would 
like to contribute, please bring your 

"He gave us a supper of very 
course fried bacon and pork, six 
boiled eggs, tolerable coffee, but no 
cream or milk, Indian pone, with so 
much grease in it that I could not eat 
it. I asked for cold bread, which 
fortunately they had, without 
shortening." 

In the meantime Aldridge came 
home and invited them to his house. 
It was also one room, but a large 
one. "There were here only two 
beds, which were occupied by him-
self and wife, another woman, and 
several children, all sick with 
measles," Colonel Gray reports. "A 
comfortable bed was spread for us 
on the floor, where I should have 
rested well but for the crying of the 
poor children who were very rest-
less. A stout Negro fellow also slept 
on the floor near us, sick with 
measles. The house was so open that 
I could see the stars through the 
apertures." The cost for this night 
was 25 cents for the supper, 75 cents 
for lodging, horse and breakfast, 
plus 25 cents additional for mending 
a coat. 

Of San Felipe, Colonel Gray de-
scribes it as "a wretched, decaying 
looking place. Five stores of small 
assortments, two mean taverns, 
and twenty or thirty scattering and 
mean looking houses, very little 
paint visible. No appearance of 
industry, of thrift or improvement 
of any kind." 

The distance from Nacogdoches 
to San Felipe, according to Colonel 
Gray, is about 200 miles, with a 
number of rivers and ' creeks to 
cross. Some can be forded on horse-
back; others require ferrying, 
usually at 25 cents for horse and 
rider. Supper, lodging, and feed for 
the horses are usually obtained at a 
farmhouse for a payment of 75 cents 
or $1. 

He described the hardships that 
are all too frequently encountered 
by the overland traveller. On the 
second night out, his party planned 
to stay at Aldridge's farm on the 
Salado, but he was not home. A 
neighbor named Little said that he 
could accomodate them. "Little's 
whole establishment consisted of a 
miserable hut about 16 feet square, 
which was kitchen, parlor, chamber 
meat house, etc.," says Colonel 
Gray. "There were two beds, and he 
had a wife and four children, the 
youngest sick with measles. Yet 
here he was to lodge us. 

it* 

contribution to Citizens Bank 
Branch in Texico. 

In other business, the tentative 
date of April 22 for the annual 
Chamber banquet was made. A 
speaker is still being sought. 

The Chamber also discussed im-
pending construction in the com-
munity, such as the Town & Country 
convenience store. 

1839: FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 15. 
In an indecisive fight with Coman-
che Indians today on the San Saba 
River near its conflux with the 

1836: TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 16. 
Colonel William F. Gray, a Vir-
ginian interested in buying Texas 
lands, and a subscriber to the Texas 
loan negotiated in New Orleans last 
month, arrived today in San Felipe 
de Austin, having travelled by 
horseback from Nacogdoches. The 
trip took him nine days. He im-
mediately called on Governor 
Henry Smith, bearing with him 
letters from General Sam Houston, 
whom he had encountered the 
second day out. Houston was on his 
way to treat with the Cherokees, 
Shawnees and other Indian tribes 
north of Nacogdoches. 

Colonel Gray reports that he was 
cordially received by Governor 
Smith, and spent an hour or two 
with him. He says that the Governor 
"expiated very freely on Texan 
affairs, and particularly on the state 
of parties." The Governor severely 
abused Stephen F. Austin, currently 
serving as one of the three com-
missioners to the United States, 
saying that "he is Mexican in his 
principles and policy, and that he 
ought to be hung!" Colonel Gray's 
frank appraisal of Governor Smith 
is that "he is a strongly prejudiced 
party man, too illiterate, too little 
informed, and not of the right 
calibre for the station he has been 
placed in." (Continued on Page 6t 
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Here's the update on the filings 
for the April 5 elections, as of 
Tuesday: 

--Farwell City Council: Three 
council posts are on the ballot. 
Martin Kube has filed for re-
election. The filing deadline is Feb. 
19. 

--Farwell School Board: Two 
seats on the ballot. Randy Kelley 

Church dinner time 
Due to heavy snows last weekend, 

the International Dinner planned by 
the youths of Hamlin Memorial 
United Methodist Church in Farwell 
was postponed last Sunday. 

has filed plus incumbents, Richard 
Haseloff and Steve Pierson. The 
filing deadline is March 5. 

--Farwell Hospital District 
Board: No one has filed. The filing 
deadline is March 5. 

--Lazbuddie School Board: Three 
seats are on the ballot. Harold Red-
wine has filed for re-election. The 
filing deadline is March 5. 

changed 
It has been rescheduled for this 

Sunday, Feb. 16, at 12:05 p.m. at the 
church. An international cuisine 
will be prepared. The public is 
invited; donations will be accepted. 

WENDOL CHRISTIAN 

Christian selected 
Wendol Christian of Bovina has 

been selected by Deaf Smith Elec-
tric Cooperative's Board of Direc-
tors to serve the remainder of the 
unexpired term of A.W. "Dub" 
Anthony, Jr., who died recently. 

Christian and his wife, Louise, are 
lifelong residents of Parmer 
County. They are the parents of four 
children, Gwen, Lanelle, Loy, and 
Tammy. 

Wendol farms, ranches and is also 
a part owner and a director on the 
boards of Agri-Sprayers and Bovina 
Pump Company. 

Christian is a lay leader of the 
Amarillo district of the Methodist 
Church and in 1962 was selected 
Bovina's Man of the Year. He is also 
past-president of the Bovina School 
Board. 

History 	 
(Continued from Page 1 ) 

GREAT 
PERFORMERS 

Phillips 66 
Regular 

and 
Unleaded 
Gasolines 

66 

OIL 
Super ND II 

and HDO 
for your 

irrigation wells 

Helton Oil, Inc. 
Serving The Texico-Farwell Area 

Phone 481-3222 

many of 
your neighbors 
insure their cars 
with State Farm? brother, John Oxley of Madison-

ville; and three grandchildren. Roger Albertson 
Services for Roger Albertson, 59, 

of Muleshoe were Wednesday at the 
First United Methodist Church with 
the Rev. Bill Kent officiating. 

Graveside services will be at 2 
p.m. Friday at Karoma Cemetery in 
Goltry, Okla., with the Rev. Keith 
Decker of Zoar Mennonite Church 
officiating. Local arrangements are 
being handled by the Ellis Funeral 
Home in Muleshoe. 

Albertson died at his home Mon-
day. Justice of the Peace Jack 
Bates ruled the death was due to 
natural causes. 

Born in Clinton, Okla., he had 
moved to Muleshoe from Lubbock in 
December 1956. He was owner and 
operator of Albertson's Shop for 
Men. He married Joyce Pekrul Oct. 
26, 1944, at Watonga, Okla. He was a 
member of the Rotary Club and a 
charter member cf the Muleshoe 
Businessmen's Association, and ac-
tive in the Muleshoe Area Industrial 
Foundation. He was a Methodist. 

Survivors include his wife; a son, 
Dr. Gary Albertson of Monahans; 
his mother, Mrs. Mable Oxley of 
Madisonville; a sister, Mrs. Marion 
Keener of Klamath Falls, Ore.; a 

Myrtle Potter 
Funeral services for Myrtle 

Potter, 92, of Farwell were Tuesday 
at United Methodist Church, White 
Deer, Texas. 

Burial was at White Deer Ceme-
tery with the Rev, Ivan Allen of-
ficiating, under the direction of 
Steed-Todd Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Potter died Feb. 8, 1986, at 
Farwell Convalescent Center. 

She was born Oct. 11, 1893, in 
Young County, Texas. She came to 
the Clovis area in 1973 to be with her 
daughter. She was a homemaker, 
librarian, and member of White 
Deer United Methodist Church. 

She married William L. Potter in 
1913, in Bomarton, Texas. 

Survivors include a daughter, 
Ione McDonald, Clovis; a son-in-
law, Dr. Harold McDonald, Clovis; 
a daughter-in-law, Marilyn Perry, 
Roswell; two sisters, Effie Pryar, 
Fort Worth, Texas, and Willie Reed, 
Bartelsville, Okla.; a brother, Ben 
Yeager, Mineral Wells, Texas; 
eight grandchildren; and twelve 
great-grandchildren. 

She was preceded in death by her 
husband, W.L. Potter, and a son, 
Tiowell Potter. 

Street. Q 
Mrs. Crume also said that Far- Third  W)  t(- 40494̀ E‘as  frio saQ0:49 ,ic;  buy the present building on 

well was the first community in the 

and this was the first urban area in 
these parts where a natural gas line vorn_ 	TH[st $AviNo$ area to have dial telephone service 

was laid. 	I sure would like 

ALL(S>UPS 
to be able to print some information 	

q 

about each of the previous owners 
and their tenures. So if you can help, 
I would sincerely appreciate it. 
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Sponsorship 
approved 

The Texico-Farwell Lions Club 
agreed Monday to sponsor two local 
youths to participate in the New 
Mexico Lions Band which will per-
form at the Lions International 
Convention in New Orleans this 
summer. 

One band student will be picked 
from Texico High and one from 
Farwell High. 

The Lions Club will pay the $575 
fee for each student. 

Here is the latest filing update 

pikes great 
geivugaiut 13-14-15, 1986 
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CONVENIENCE STORES 

itt  

Ends training 
Army National Guard Private 

James Dimas, son of Geneva Ortiz 
of Texico, and Jimmy Dimas of 
Logan, N.M., has completed basic 
training at Fort Jackson, S.C. 

During the training, students re-
ceived instruction in drill and 
ceremonies, weapons, map reading, 
tactics, military courtesy, military 
justice, first aid, and Army history 
and traditions. 
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ALLSUP'S 

REFILLS' ONLY 25' .99 ONLY 

WITH LARGE COFFEE 
OR REGULAR 

HOT CHOCOLATE

ONLY 

ALLSUP'S 

ALLSUP'S 

ce CT 69 et. 
LAY'S R' REGULAR, 
BARBECUE, SOUR CREAM & ONION 

Pte. 
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• $109 REGULAR 
$1.39 

NOW ONLY 

6-Pack 12-oz. 
• 
• 
• 
• 
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• MOVIE & VCR 
• RENTALS 
• The Very Best in 

Home Video • 
• Entertainment! 

Coca-Cola 
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• 
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• 
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• 

ALL YOU NEED 
IS YOUR TV! 
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0 
Hesston 1014+2... 
one fast cuttin' 
Center-Pivot 
Windrowed 0 

• 

Self-propelled performance at a pull-type price! • 
The Model 1014 + 2 features high-speed 2-Sickle, Double Swaybar 

Headers in 12- or 14-foot widths. You get top capacity with 1820 strokes-
per-minute...and smooth, dependable cutting with total hydraulic power. 

The hydrostatic header drive and total hydraulic header positioning give 
you the maneuverability of a self-propelled machine...at a pull-type price! 
And 2-Sickle Headers provide less vibration and less maintenance. 

Model 1014 + 2...self-propelled capacity with high-speed 2-Sickle design. 
See it at your Hesston dealer now! 

• 

FRY & COX, Inc. 
401 1st. Muleshoe 	272-4511 

sti HEssroN THE PRIME LINE • 

• 

JON Ce PONTIAC MC 
LuJEEP RENAULT 

Hlway 60-70-84 East Clovis, NW Mexico 
PIR0110 762-2986 

GM QUALITY 
SERVICE PARTS 

GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Home of the "Roadrunner." 
If( 	 move fast to beat our deals." 

"You really have to 
.111=11111 
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Honor Society has induction 'Wolverine' may be ordered 

	

Texico students may order the 	high; and Mrs. Kittrell, high school, 

	

Refreshments were served to the 	1986 "Wolverine" through Feb. 21. 	will accept deposits. 

	

families and faculty members. The 	The basic cost of the yearbook is 	Final payments must be made by 

	

table was set with a white cloth, 	$13, and students may reserve their 	May 9. Personalized copies cost $2 

	

punch, sandwiches and coffee were 	copies with a $7 deposit. 	 extra. Plastic protective covers cost 

	

served. The cake was made by one 	School secretaries, Mrs. Morin, 	$1 extra. 

	

of the members, Eldonna Francis. 	elementary; Mrs. Jesko, junior 

The Texico Silver Stylus Chapter 
of the National Honor Society had 
its induction Feb. 12 at the Educa-
tional Complex. 

The officers are: Melissa Single-
terry, president, Lucia Jesko, vice-
president, and Coy Jo Burk, sec-
retary-treasurer. 

Melissa Singleterry welcomed the 
families and faculty members. Ken 
Shaw, high school principal, intro-
duced the inductees. The inductees 
were seated in the auditorium, then 
they came up the runway to the 
center stage and were seated. 

Also seated on stage were James 
Pierce, Ken Shaw, Dr. Gary Single-
terry and Juanita Hadley. 

Coy Jo Burk introduced the 
speaker, Dr. Gary Singleterry. He 
spoke on wisdom. The first one is to 
listen to parents and teachers for 
wise counseling. Second is to have a 
good name and reputation and be 
truthful and kind. Third is to work 
diligently; fourth, trust in God; and 
fifth, don't give up on yourself. 

Lucia Jesko administered the 
oath to inductees Marlin Carpenter, 
senior; Dean Lewis a junior and 
Codie Burch, Jeff Horner, Twilla 
Longo and Robon Pierce all sopho-
mores. Not present was Petra 
Breyne. 

Baptist churches 
will merge 

A special merger service is 
planned at 7 p.m. Sunday at the 
First Baptist Church of Farwell tq 
signify the official merging of that 
church with the Oklahoma Lane 
Baptist Church. 

The Oklahoma Lane Church has 
been served by Rev. Strauss Atkin-
son, a retired missionary. He lives 
in Plainview, Texas. 

Dr. Floyd Bradley will speak at 
the special merger service, at which 
time members of the Oklahoma 
Lane church will become members 
of the First Baptist Church. 

Giveaway set 
The federally-sponsored cheese 

and butter giveaway for Parmer 
County Pct. 3 will be from 9 a.m. to 5 
p.m. Feb. 13 at the Farwell Com-
munity Center, County Commis-
sioner Robert White announced. 

$5.19 
EACH 

vvvvvirvirvvvvirvvvvvvvvvv yms, 
; 	United Drug 
; 	Of Farwell 

.9th & Ave. A 	 - 481-9100 
IF 	9 a.m. to 1 p.m. CDT Monday thru Friday 

a.m. to 1 p.m. CDT Saturday 
12 oz. 100 TABLETS 2101- TOWN •SERVICEAMTTOWPRTCEST 

;$1.87 

IP 

1p 2.5 oz. 

V 
V 
V 
V 

IF I niAY $5.29 
IP 

\msEm14 oz. 
IF 

; 

Additional sausage is on sale for 
$2.50 per pound. It can be ordered by 
calling Mary Mesman at 825-3767. 

$3.87 

4 oz. 

St. Ann's Catholic Church of 
Bovina will hold its annual German 
sausage dinner Feb. 16, from 11 
a.m. to 2 p.m. 

This year's menu will include 
homemade German sausage, 
creamed potatoes and gravy, green 
beans, sauerkraut, jello salad, 
relish tray, rolls and butter, carrot 
cake or chocolate cake, coffee or 
tea. 

Tickets will be on sale at the door. 
They cost $5 for adults, and $2.50 for 
children under 10. 

Sittittect 

FRIDAY, FEB. 14 
Texico A-B boys and A girls 

basketball team will play Dora at 
Dora at 5 p.m. (MST). V 

SHAKE 11 
HOT COCOA V 
PUDDING ir 

NUTRITION I, 
BARS 

OIL of 
OLAY 

$1.37 3.5 oz. $529  tet 

• $1.09 
said Coach Borde Williams. Geneva 
Garcia is a 5'8" sophomore and 
plays the wing position. "She is an 
outstanding prospect, a good re-
bounder and defensive player. She 
is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jesse Garcia. Eric Harding is a 6'2" 
senior and plays the post position. 
"With his size, Harding has the 
capacity to be a threat both of-
fensively and defensively. His im-
provement over the season has been 
greatly recognized," said Williams. 

Council to meet 

Lovable Huggables 
Reg. '6.99 

'4.99 The National Cotton Council will 
have a meeting Feb. 14 at 9 a.m. at 
the Muleshoe High School audi-
torium. It will focus on the 1986 farm 
bill. VVVVVVVVVVVVVVIIV V V IMP IP V il,V411 

Four Texico basketball players 
were chosen, from left, Angie Lig-
gins is a 5'7" sophomore. She plays 
post position. "She is probably our 
most aggressive player. She is a 
good rebounder and ball handler," 
said Coach Roy King. She is the 
daughter of Mrs. Alma Maxwell. 
Jim Thornton is a 5'10" senior and 
plays the wing position. "Thornton 
has the capability to' be a solid 
contributor to the Texico basketball 
team. He has a good outside shot 
which adds strength to the team," 

DUE TO DEMAND.... HELEN ROMO Bookkeeping & Tax Service 

Computerized service for bookkeeping, tax returns, 

payroll and accounts receivable TIE JONES BOYS AND GAL CONTINUE 
THE Stuediteakt sate  1111 247-3500 247-2353 913 Washington Friona, Texas 

1986 BONNEVILLE 
STOCK NO. 13510 

LIST 	 12,487.00 
DISCOUNT 	 1542.96 

Safe  10944.04 
60 MONTHLY PAYMENTS AT 9% 
A.P.R., $1000.00 DOWN PAYMENT 
PLUS TAX, TITLE AND LICENSE, 
TOTAL DEFERRED SALE PRICE 
$13,480.00. *20 00 

PER MONTH 

1986 JEEP COMANCHE 
STOCK NO. 52001 

LIST 
	 7795.00 

DISCOUNT 
	

747.55 

Sate $7047.45 

$ 1 3 00 PER MONTH 

48 MONTHLY PAYMENTS. 7 9% 
A.P.R., 51500.00 DOWN PAYMENT 
PLUS TAX & LICENSE, TOTAL 
DEFERRED SALE PRICE 58028.00. 

MANY MORE AT SIMILAR SAVINGS 

4r, 

The new inductees in the Texico 
National Honor Society are, from 
left, Robin Pierce, Twilla Longo, 

Jeff Horner, Codie Burch, Dean 
Lewis and Marlin Carpenter. Not 
pictured was Petra Breyne. 

German sausage dinner upcoming 

100 TABLETS 

$3.87 

litee Weitueteges 

Pregnancy 

Test 

; $7.99 

YOUR 

CHOICE 

8oz. 

• 

1986 PARISIENNE 
STOCK NO. 14009 

LIST 	 13,719.00 
DISCOUNT 	 2171.65 

Sate $11547.35 

*25 	00 60 MONTHLY PAYMENTS AT 
15.0% A.P.R., 51000.00 DOWN PAY ,  
MENT PLUS TAX. TITLE AND 
LICENSE, TOTAL DEFERRED 

PER MONTH SALE PRICE $16,180.00. 

1986 RENAULT ALLIANCE 
STOCK NO 40001 

LIST 
DISCOUNT 

Sate $6845.03 

7629.00 
783.97 

*13 10 	4819  %M 
A.P.R.
ON  TH L $Y1  P 7.00Y MDNNT S F. 

AY 
MaNT PLUS 	

AT 

TAX AND LICENSE, 
TOTAL DEFERRED SALE PRICE 

PER MONTH $1788.°0- 

Look at what's NEW! 

"There's More to Love" 
A women's plus sizes boutique 

WINTER CLEARANCE SALE! WITH SAYINGS UP TO 50%  

519 Main 	 9:30-5:30 	 Formerly 
Clovis 	 Stout Sizes Boutique Mon.-Sat. 

NS.< 000000 00004 NONNIK 0 
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MR. AND MRS. CARLISS WOODS 

ROBERT GREEN 
411IIIIIII 

MULESHOE * TEXAS * 

$500 Cash 
Back 

On Any GM Car Or Truck Leased. 

Robert Green Inc. 
will pay for the following: 

1. Your Tax! 
2. Your License! 
3. Your Registration! 
4. Your First Payment! 
5. Your Security Deposit! 
6. 48 month unlimited mileage warranty! 

7. Plus, pay you $500.00 Cash Back 
Upon Delivery 
8. Drive a new car or truck with 

no initial investment! 
(With GMAC Approved Credit) 

For More Information Call 

To 	Free '762-2772 

Salemen 

Ken James 	 Jeff Steelman 

Al Nuitall 
	

Larry Roubison 

7o. 
0 

Robert Green Inc. 

Call Toll Free 762-2772 • 
i\\")  

P 
-So 

Clovis 

Muleshoe 
272-4588 	GM Parts and Service 

2400 W. American Blvd. Muleshoe, Texas 

Clovis 
762.2772 

Clovis Shopping Guide 

Ktibeeo 6 - I g 

pushy* 3 - 15 

Baby Specialty Shop 
\ 	Shower Selections 

' 	i/ 	Available 

1 sei % 
-./ 

1   Addi'llONS 
-- ---41 2400 N. PRINCE 'ha 

762-3301 
g• 

500 Maim, Untie - (505) 763-7153 
Margie Crooks & Ruth Reid 

WE FEATURE 
SUNBURST FIREPLACES 1505) 763-6830 

5100 NORTH PR;NCE 
CLOVIS NM 88101 

THE "SCENTSIBLE" SHOP 

7 Hilltop Plaza - Clovis 

[505] 763-6700 & Netasterst  
Candles - Gifts For Every Occasion 

ALL TYPES MASONRY & SUPPLIES 
COMMERCIAL AND RESIDENTIAL 

NEW MEXICO LIC 4  2239 

Brand'n Iron Bar-131 WE TRADE AND SELL PAPERBACK BOOKS 
GIFTS FOR ALL OCCASIONS 
GAG GIFT HEADQUARTERS We do catering 0 custom cooking 

Corner of Norris C Mabry 	 Eat !ere or Take Out 

Mon-Thur 10 a.m. - 0 p.m.; Fri C Sat - 10 a.m. - 9 p.m. 

702-7322 
Beef - Pork Ribs - Sausage 

Hickory Smoked by Floyd Trantham 

garico 

Gift Shop & Book Exchange 

1301 N PRINCE 
CLOVIS. N MEX.88101 

PHONE (505) 763.772Q 

FUR FEATHERS 

THE ,..Jungle 
RUSTY SUN 

EATERY 

769.1569 

1708 N. Prince 
Tropical Birds 
Tropical Fish 

Small Animals 
Mon-Sat. 11 am-5:30 Thurs. open to 8 pm 

517 Main Street 
763-3118 

THE WAY YOU WANT EM' 
SANDWICHES 

THE 
SHOE STRING 

Consignment On Nice Clothes & Accessories 
New Indian Jewelry & Gifts 

919 Main 
Clovis, N.M. 88101 

Store Hours 
9 to 5 Tuesday thru Saturday 

762-5210 

v,OYDN 

BRAKE & ALIGNMENT SERVICE 

gueoclas ilvtou9fi 6aticatti  

ktO NI C4iiiiiltulat"arrilita"  sue. guadz gait. 44#19  

\t"ANA 	762-7657 
contithation6 

A 	
106 W. 5th 

si   
Hair designed with YOU in mind 

39 YEARS IN CLOVIS 

• CUSTOM MUFFLER INSTALLATION 

' PROFFSSIONAL DISC e. ()Rum TURNING 

RAY BOYD 

763 4326 
160S MABRY DR 

CLOVIS 

\ Stork 
- 	kap 

Infant', and 
Maternity 

Wear 
1:l12 slain 763-7113 

W1)ere your appearance Is our coiecero. 

Veldoppa's 
WOMEN'S 

Open 10-6 

f lub Mall 
:321 K. Malr) 

OWC)er 

Dation Harris 
762-7761 

Daily Luncheon Specials 	$395  
TRY OUR NEW SOUP & SALAD BAR 

PROMPT DE \/ELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM -- 

LARGE SELECTION 
PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

O.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

617 Main 
2400 N. Prince 

• 
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School Board 
renews contracts 

30th anniversary 

The Farwell School Board 
Monday renewed the contracts for 
its athletic director and principals. 

The AD is Monte Barnes. The 
principals are James Craig, Jerry 
Dee Owen and Lynn Burton, All four 
receives raises; they didn't get 
raises last year, said School Supt. 
John Grigsby. 

Grigsby noted that under new 
state law the day off Monday due to 
snow will have to be made up by 
students and teachers. The two pos-
sibilities are March 31 or May 30; a 
decision will be made later. 

In other business, the board: 
--Changed the date of its March 

meeting from the 10th to the 14th. 
--Appointed a nominating corn- 

Carliss and Irene Woods were 
honored Feb. 9 in their home with a 
surprise 30th anniversary celebra-
tion. 

The couple was married Feb. 11, 
1956 in the First Baptist Church in 
Farwell. 

Hosting the celebration were their 

mittee to seek persons to run for the 
School Board; the election is April 5. 

--Heard Burton report on the cri-
teria used for giving scholarships 
and awards at graduation time. No 
changes were made. 

—Decided to ask the Parmer 
County Commissioners to divide its 
Permanent School Fund into 
separate accounts for each school, 
after a scholastic census is taken. 

• The Farwell Schools have no plans 
to seek money from the account at 
this time but believes that if the 
funds were in four different "pots," 
it would make it easier for a school 
requesting funds to just get its 
portion. 

children Mike and Leigh Ann 
Woods, Greg and Sheryl Taylor, and 
David Woods, all of Farwell. 

Those in attendance were Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Dollar, Mr. and Mrs. 
Willie Hardage and Mrs. Myrtle 
Withrow, along with their children, 
grandchildren and "Singe." 

Sherrill to repair 

district courtroom 

a a 441IMINflSOp HOME( e 
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THANK YOU 

SECURITY STATE BANK 
for buying my fourth place Cross Barrow at 
the Parmer County Junior Livestock Show. 

LEONARD HILLOCK 
'et 	,0()S14 le )000c Mac 

• 
• 

• 

The Parmer County Commission-
ers Monday awarded the contract 
for repairing the district courtroom 
to Sherrill Lumber of Bovina. 

Sherrill bid $14,987. Other bidders 
were O.D. Cole and Jimmy Meeks, 
both of whom submitted lower bids 
than Sherrill. County Judge Porter 
Roberts said the commissioners felt 
that Sherrill's bid was the "best 
bid." 

Repairs will include new ceiling 
tiles in front of the balcony plus 
matching tiles under the balcony 
(the part which collapsed in Decem-
ber), a new carpet for the floor, 
rearranging the judge's bench and 
raising it six inches, rearranging , 
the courtroom, putting the jury box 
on the south side of the room instead 

of the present north side and closing 
the windows. 

In other business, the commis-
sioners agreed to rent its new voting 
booths to governmental units want-
ing to use them for $50 per unit on a 
first-come, first-serve basis. Laz-
buddie Schools have inquired into 
their possible use in their election. 

The next commissioners' meeting 
was changed to Feb. 20 because the 
commissioners will be attending a 
school at Texas A&M starting Feb. 
24. All the commissioners, except 
for Tommy Williams, and Roberts 
are expected to attend. 

Two citizens asked for help on 
paying their gas bills. One was 
turned down; the other received 
$181.81 from the commissioners. 

Texico council awards bids 
The Texico City Council Tuesday 

received two bids for installing a 
fence around the former landfill. 

Shirley Fencing, of Portales, and 
Heart Enterprises of Texico (Max 
Carter) were the bidders. Heart was 
low bidder at $5,000. 

The council also received a bid 
from Heart for work at the senior 
citizens center, for $2,718. It also 
was approved. The work will in-
clude remodeling the bathroom and 

• 
• • • • 

some electrical circuit work. 
The council approved sending 

City Attorney Duane Hamar to a 
two-day seminar on land usage at 
Albuquerque. 

City Marshal Fred Hamner re-
ported that a Farwell man drove his 
truck into the senior citizens center 
last week and is willing to fix the 
damage to the masonry himself if 
the council wanted him to do it. The 
council agreed with his proposal. 

•.: 
es  
•• 
• 
• • • 
•• 
• 

• 
:rap 

• 
4.•  
• • 

Some offices to be closed 
Several government offices in the 

Twin ties will be closed Feb. 17 in 
honor of Washington's Birthday. 

These offices include both Texico 
and Farwell post offices, ASCS 
office, and the Farmers Home Ad- 

• 4 

ministration office. Both the Texico 
and. Farwell banks will be -closed, 
also. 

Parmer County Courthouse will 
remain open, as well as the Farwell 
and Texico city halls. 

4IP 

rti  

• 
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$41 O99 

Ic 7 # t 

HAVE YOUR EASTER 

PICTURES TAKEN NOW 

WE USE 

KODAK PAPER 

D'LYNN EUBANK AND JOHN HALE 

VISA MASTERCMD TURNER CHARGE 
520 MAIN - CLOVIS 

Free Parking in rear of store. 

OPEN DAILY 9:00-5:00 saintafte 
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Farwell youths honored 
Members of Texico-Farwell Pack 

213 of the Cub Scouts participated in 
the Blue and Gold Banquet held at 
Lockwood School in Clovis Jan. 30. 

The Wolf den, under the leader-
ship of Lynne Mahaney, provided 
cakes for the drawings. Cub Scout 
Michael Phillips of the Wolf den 
received his Bobcat badge. 

The Bear den, under the leader-
ship of Ricky Bennett, presented 
skits. Participating in the skits 
were: Reace Bennett, Klay Camp, 
Eric Delgado, Lupito Garza, and 
Donnie Grissom. 

The Webelos den, under the 
leadership of Judy Pomper, pre-
pared a table decoration, and 
awards for some of the adults who 
had helped their den — Lynne Ma- 

*DANIEL'S 
YOUR WALL TO WALL STORE 

haney, Ed and Gwen Corn, Martin 
Chandler, Ricky Bennett, Mary-
anne Price and Charles Aycock. 
They also displayed some of their 
projects and photos. 

Receiving their Weblos badges 
were: Robbie Pomper, Mark 
Chapdler, Clay Corn, Kevin Welch, 
and Jody Mahaney. They also re-
ceived their pins for the Sportsman 
activity. 

Jody Mahaney, Kevin Welch, 
Mark Chandler, and Robbie Pom-
per received their Citizen pins. 

The boys and parents enjoyed a 
pot luck supper, also. 

ad Weei 

CHERRY WINKS 

• 
Engagement told 

JACKIE BORN AND PAUL BRIGHAM 

The approaching marriage of 
Jackie Born, daughter of Mrs. Ruth 
McFadden of Corona, Calif., and 
Paul Brigham, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Brigham of Farwell, has 
been announced. 

890  Deposit 

1 000  Due at 
Pick up 

(plus tax) 

1-10x13 
Mall Photo) 

1- Bx10 

2- 5x7 
2- 3x5 

16-King Size Wallets 
8-Regular Size Wallets 

High School and Wayland Baptist 
University. He received a master of 
divinity from Southwestern Baptist 
Theological Seminary in 1983 and 
currently is pastor of the Progress 
Baptist Church. 

The wedding will be at 2 p.m. 
March 1 at the Progress Baptist 
Church. Pat Riley, minister of the 
First Baptist Church of Farwell, 
will officiate. All friends and rel-
atives are invited. 

Miss Born is a graduate of Brea, 
Calif., High School. She currently is 

employed at Pathfinder Christian 
Book Store in Covina, Calif. 

Brigham is a graduate of Farwell 

V3 c. shortening 
1/2  c. sugar 
1 t. grated lemon peel 
I t. vanilla 
1 egg 
2 T. milk 
1 c. flour 
1/2  t. baking powder 
1/4  t. soda 
1/4  t. salt 

Thoroughly cream together first 
four ingredients. Add egg and milk 
and beat. Sift dry ingredients to-
gether and add to creamed mixture, 
mixing well. Roll dough by tea-
spoons in crushed Sugar Frosted 
Flakes. Place two inches apart on 
greased cookie sheet, topping each 
with 1,4 maraschino cherry on other 
topping. Bake at 400 degrees about 
12 minutes. Cool and remove from 
pan. Makes 3 dozen. 

ALL 
DINETTES 

ON 
SALE! 

ceowleat zea 
Fred Geries of Farwell is in the 

Clovis High Plains Hospital. He is 
slowly improving. It is hoped that he 
will be home this weekend. 

a s  

AT 

Capitol Foods 

901 Ave. A Farwell 

Tuesday, Feb. 18 

830 - 7 
ONE DAY ONLY 

Lewis Cooper of Texico is in the 
University Hospital, 2211 Lomas 
Blvd. N.E., Room 418 Albuquerque, 
N.M. 87106. "He is in satisfactory 
condition. He had extensive sur-
gery, but doctors are pleased," 
according to Dardanella Helton. 

* • • 

Bob Hammonds of Farwell is in 
the Clovis High Plains Hospital. 

• * * 

Cecil Atcheley of Farwell is in the 
Clovis High Plains Hospital. 

Group charge 
99C per person 

Engagement announced 

`Prodigal' seen 
"The Prodigal" was seen Sunday 

afternoon by 21 youths and several 
adults. After the film they were 
placed in discussion groups. 

They also had snacks. 
The film examined the gradual 

spiritual and emotional breakdown 
of an American family. 

It was sponsored by the First 
Baptist Church of Farwell. 

FOR CREATIVE COLOR PORTRAITS Age  

in Construction Design. He is 
presently employed by Sherwin-
Williams Co. of Lubbock. 

The wedding is set for Saturday, 
March 15, 1986, in the Garden Room' 
of the Timbers of Willow Hill 
Apartments in Lubbock. 

0 	.1 	• • 

fiztuatd %a eva 

Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Eubank of 
tranvf)11, announce the engagement 

and approaching marriage of their 
daughter, D'Lynn, to John Dow 
Hale, son of Jane Hale of Clovis, and 
Jim Hale of Albuquerque. 

The bride elect is a 1978 graduate 
of Farwell High School and attended 
Abilene Christian University and 
Lubbock Christian College. She is 
employed in Lubbock by the Law 
Offices of Patrick C. Simek. 

Her fiance is a 1978 graduate of 
Slovis High School and will grad-

uate in May from Texas Tech Uni-
versity with a degree in Landscape 
Architecture with a Specialization 

THURSDAY, FEB. 20 
Parmer County Commissioners' 

Court will meet at 11 a.m. at the 
courtroom. 

SAVE! SAVE! SAVE! 
Decorator Etagere 

20% 
TO 

50% 
CIFF!! 

Elegant in any 
room as a wall 
unit, bookcase or 
room divider. With 
our exclusive 
decorator finish, it 
enhances any 
decor. Ample space 
for displaying 
collectibles, curios, 
books and plants. 
Large drawer at 
the bottom is great 
for storing silver, 
linens, playing 
cards, and 
valuables. Easy to 
assemble. 
241.5(12"x53" tall 

only 

$1099' 

FLORAL FINERY 

Hothouse look is 
a hit for spring 
with blooms com-
ing up on a great cot-
ton cardigan. Under-
neath, a tucked jewel 
neck cotton/poly 
bodice over graph 
patterned straight 
skirt of fine cotton/ 
poly "whisper linen". 
Blue or tan combina-
tions, 

Sizes 10P 	14P 

NEW 
SHIPMENT 

LARGE 
SELECTION! 

SEnviNG CLOvIS. SINCE 1939 

FURNITURE INC 

763-7121 

I 
601 Main Clovis 

IIIMIICKANIOGIRailliKa)1111fliltk=11fl 

• Furniture • Appliances • Gift items • Bedding 

1020 Main 	-we Service What e Sell" 	7624481 



Friday, Feb. 7 thru 
Sunday, Feb. 23 

at participating stores. 
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FARWELL INSURANCE 
AGENCY, INC. 

We Work For You 

Box 245 - Ph. 481-9372 - Farwell, Texas 
04. 

• ea 	 a a a. a  

High performance 
hybrids to make 
the most of your 

, irrigation program! 
Water isn't cheap. So naturally, you need corn hybrids 
with the genetic potential to come along with you and yield 

the highest level your management can reach. That's why 3377 
and 3186 make the perfect combination on the Plains Plant full-

season 
 

3186 on your best land where it can express its full potential. Then 
round out your irrigated corn program with earlier maturing 3377 

As companions, they give you a powerful combination of high yield and 
performance characteristics you need. 

3377 Superior yielder Outstanding heat and drouth tolerance. 
Excellent for delayed plantings. Tall wide-leafed hybrid with good ground 

shading. Large, girthy ears. 

3186 What a yielder! Excellent heat and drouth tolerance. Tall, 
semi-upright leafed hybrid Superior standability. Excellent late season plant 

health plus MDMV and heat smut resistance. 

See one of these Pioneer dealers right away. 

Fred Chandler 
451-3343 

Jerry Monk 
481-3810 

Gilbert Kahwasser 
825-3953 

(PIONEER  
BRAND . SEEDS 

0 	  

a 

Registered trademark of Pioneer Hr-Bred International. Inc 
Pioneer' brand products are sold subject to the terms and conditions of sale which are part of the labeling and 

sale documents Pioneer is a brand name. numbers identity varieties ,o P.41, .11•13 
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Sesquicentennial 	 
( Continued from Page 1) 

with the clothes they had worn into 
battle. They got little food, and were 
threatened with being shot. They 
started a long march to Mexico City 
on December 31, first going out ofa 
their way to Matamoros. Now, after ‘11V  
six weeks of extreme hardship, they 
have reached Rancho Salado, and 
still have more than 400 miles to go. 

upper Colorado, Captain John H. 
Moore reports that the Comanches 
lost about 30 killed and an equal 
number wounded. One of his men 
was killed and six wounded men had 
to be carried back on litters. The 
Texians' horses had been stam-
peded by the Indians, and many had 
to return on foot. 

••• 

1843: FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 10. 
Prisoners of the unfortunate Meir 
Expedition arrived today at Rancho 
Salado, about 120 miles south of the 
Mexican city of Saltillo. The exact 
number of prisoners is not known, 
since some have died since their 
surrender at the Battle of Meir last 
December 26. At that time, Mexican 
General Pedro de Ampudia report-
ed that he had captured 248, includ-
ing many who were severely 
wounded. 

After their capture, the prisoners 
were marched to Matamoros by 
tvay of Camargo and Reynosa, in 
which towns they were paraded as 
bells were rung and citizens cele-
brated. They reached Matamoros 
on January 9, and set out from there 
on January 14 for Monterrey, which 
they reached on January 29, On 
February 2 they proceeded to 

thought they were being offered 
prisoners of war status, and 
accepted the terms. The 42 or 43 left 
across the river were not included. 

However, once the Texians sur-
rendered their arms, they were not 
treated as prisoners of war. Their 
belongings were plundered by Mex-
ican soldiers, leaving them only 

THIS WEEK 
IN THE 

REPUBLIC 
stszatoorS OF TEXAS 

SPONSORS ARE: 
:Five Area Telephone Cooperative 	Franse Irrigation 

Sherley-Anderson Grain (Lariat) 	Security State Bank 

Farmers Cooperative Elevator 	Worley Mills 

Eastern New Mexico Rural Telephone Cooperative 

West Texas Rural Telephone Cooperative 
I 
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Crisp, tender, chicken-fried fingers of 100% beef, golden fries, 
Texas toast and creamy country gravy. That's the one and only 

Dairy Queen Country Basket. So come on by for the Texas taste 
that's just this side of heaven — now at a heavenly sale price! 

separate from Somervell to con-
tinue their expedition. The others 
joined Somervell, and most reached 
San Antonio by January 8, thus 
ending the Somervell Expedition. 

The splinter group, now without 
official authorization, elected as 
their commander Captain William 
S. Fisher, who had served as Sec-
retary of War in President 
Houston's first administration, but 
who had lately fallen upon hard 
times. On December 22 they crossed 
the river near Mier, and entered the 
town without resistance. They de-
manded provisions and clothing, 
and took the alcalde back to their 
camp across the river as a hostage. 
Their demands were not fulfilled, 
and after waiting two days, they 
learned from a captured Mexican 
that General Pedro de Ampudia of 
Matamoros had occupied the town 
with a large force. 

The Texians immediately deter-
mined to engage him in battle. It 
was Christmas morning, and by late 
that afternoon, they had crossed the 
river, leaving behind some 42 or 43 
men who were sick or lame. They 
entered Mier after dark, under a 
constant exchange of rifle fire, and 
reached a street leading to the 
square, where enemy artillery was 
located. They occupied houses in the 
town, breaking openings from one 
house to another to approach the 
square, and by daylight they were 
close enough to silence the artillery 
with rifle fire. By late afternoon 
some 12 Texians had been killed and 
many wounded, including Captain 
Fisher, who was shot in the hand. 
They had killed several hundred 
Mexicans, but still faced a force of 
some 2,000. 

General Ampudia sent out a 
captured Texians with a white 
parley flag and demanded their 
surrender on terms that were three-
fold: that they would be "treated 
with the consideration which is in 
accordance with the magnamious 
Mexican nation;" that there would 
be no reprisals against Texians who 
had previously been captured in the-
Santa Fe Expedition and had been 
released on condition that they 
would not again bear arms against 
Mexico; and that the Texians must 
give up their arms. Captain Fisher 

number of them went back and be-
gan to pillage everyhing they could 
lay their hands on, especially 
horses, mules, food, and specie if 
they could find it. That afternoon, 
when General Somervell discovered 
what had happened, he put a stop to 
it and demanded that everything be 
returned. This created much dis-
satisfaction. 

The next morning, December 10, 
General Somervell announced that 
those who wished to, could return to 
their homes, and 187 men availed 
themselves of this permission. They 
left under Colonels J.L. Bennett and 
Jesse L. McCrocklin. Most of them 
were militiamen from Montgomery 
County, and they arrived home 
around the middle of last month. 

The remaining army made a 
difficult march through mud and 
cactus toward Guerrero, some 50 
miles down-river. On December 14 
there was a brief brush with Mex-
ican forces. On December 16 they 
crossed the river and entered Guer-
rero without resistance, demanding 
supplies and 100 horses to replace 
those they had lost. When these 
were not forthcoming the next day, 
they demanded $5,000 instead. The 
town brought in only $381, claiming 
that they had been stripped by a 
Mexican army that was billetted 
there a short time before. 

On December 19, General Som-
.ervell received reports of large con-
centration of Mexican troops near-
by, and issued an order for his small 
army of slightly more than 500 men 
to return to Gonzales to be dis-
banded. This brought to a head the 

-"growing dissatisfaction of most of-
ficers and men with their lack of 
action and lack of loot. A mass 
meeting was held, and 305 voted to 

Historic Recipe 
of the Week 

• 

Saltillo, and from there to Rancho 
Salado. They are being taken to 
Mexico City for long-term imprison-
ment. 

The Mier Expedition was an un-
authorized offshoot of the Somervell 
Expedition of last fall. After the 
invasion of San Antonio last Sep-
tember 11 by a large Mexican force 
under General Adrian Woll, who 
held the town for 10 days and then 
left with 52 prisoners, a vociferous 
demand for retaliation spread 
among Texians. President Sam 
Houston deemed it necessary to act, 
even though he has always opposed 
offensive war against Mexico. He 
selected General Alexander Somer-
vell as the most likely commander 
to keep matters from getting out of 
hand, and on October 13 ordered 
him to establish a camp near San 
Antonio to recruit volunteers, but 
only those "with a firm resolve to be 
obedient to orders." Texian volun-
teers are nortorious for their un-
willingness to submit to discipline. 
Since the Republic is without funds, 
no supplies or arms for the vol-
unteer army were to be issued. 

Eventually, on November 25, the 
Somervell Expedition set out for 
Laredo with some 750 men. Al-
though Laredo is on the Texas side 
of the Rio Grande, it has always 
been an enemy garrison. After a 
difficult march of some 150 miles, 
they entered the city on the morning 
of December 8, encountering no 
resistance. The small garrison of 
some 80 men had advance notice of 
their coming and had fled the town, 
along with most of the leading 
citizens and their valued posses-
sions. 

That night the Texans camped 
outside the city. The next morning a 

Mr. and Mrs. Ron Cruddas of 
Alamogordo, N.M., are the parents 
of a baby boy, Trent Bradley, born 
February 5, at Gerald Champion 
Hospital in Alamogordo. 

The new arrival weighed 8 
pounds, 4 ounces, and was 21 inches 
long. 

Trent has one sister, Genessa Lee, 
5. 

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Sudderth of Alamogordo, for-
mally of Farwell, and Lillian Crud-
das of Killeen, Texas. Great-grand-
parents are Lela Gaines of Alamo-
gordo and Hermina Herzog of 
Wharton, Texas. 

Mrs. Cruddas is the former 
Rhonda Sudderth. 

PATTY SHELLS 
AND FILLINGS 

Roll pie crust very thin; invert 
patty tins and cover with crust; 
bake on top shelf in oven, then put 
away until needed. 

Buses slated 
A student bus for Farwell High 

students only will go to the Farwell 
ball game Monday night. There is 
no charge. 

Also, there will be a parents bus, 
costing $2 apiece. Call 481-3351 for 
reservations. 

Tickets for the game will be $2 for 
adults and $1 for students. 

Party slated 
The Farwell Convalescent auxil-

iary will host a Valentine party Feb. 
14 at 3 p.m. 

Auxiliary members are to bring 
cookies and Valentines. 

Break nears 
Beginning Feb. 21, Farwell stu-

dents will have a week off from 
school, thanks to Spring Break. 

School will resume at its usual 
t•me, Feb. 27. 
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The business of the meeting will include: 

Financial Report 	Progress Report 

General Condition Report on the Cooperative 

Also, there will 	be an election of Directors from DISTRICTS 4, 5 and 	7, 

along with any other business that should come before the meeting. 

Make Your Plans To Be Present 

At Your Cooperative Meeting! 
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RRUCBCJTRUTHVBYXKSEWD 
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JOHN 8: 31-32 

CAN YOU FIND THE WORDS PRINTED BELOW 

IN THE WORD SEARCH PUZZLE? 

If you abide in my words, then you are truly 

disciples of mine; and you shall know the truth, 

and the truth shall make you free. 

Farwell Church of Christ 
481-3833 

There are so many things 
a farmer needs today.... 

CROP INSURANCE 	 AUTO INSURANCE 

WORKERS COMP 	 LIFE INSURANCE 

LIABILITY 	 ANIMAL MORTALITY 

HEALTH INSURANCE 	DWELLINGS & BLDG. INS. 
RETIREMENT INCOME 

Now Professional Farmers may buy complete insurance 

protection from one Agency and at a Big Savings. 

• 

I L' • .1E2; 
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: 	
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Henry 
Insurance Agency 

111 W. Ave. B Muleshoe 

806/272-4581 
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Basketball Action 
Teutotacial tie Steett Steerettes lose finale 

the loss of Sherilyn Thigpen due to 
the stock show." 

Scoring for Farwell were Shonda 
Foster, 12; Cheryl Stanton, 7; Alma 
Nicolas, 7; Ursula Dollar, 2; Laura 
Wolfe, 4 and Robbi Fly with 4. 

Outstanding defensive players in 
the game were Dollar, Trena 
George and Fly, said Langan. 

Cheryl Stanton is a senior at Far-
well High School. She is a third year 
starter. "During this time her skills 
have improved. She will be hard to 
replace because of her fighting 
spirit and desire and competitive-
ness. We will miss her in our offense 
next year," said Coach George 
Langan. 

The Farwell varsity basketball 
girls lost their last game of the 
season to Kress Feb. 11, 58-36. 

In the first quarter the Steerettes 
were down 16-4. However, their play 
improved in the second, third and 
fourth quarters. 

"It was a night to let everybody 
play," said Coach George Langan. 
"We were trying to recognize all our 
varsity players. The entire second 
half was a better ball game, as 
Kress only outscored us by 3 points. 
We were handicapped because of 
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Texico 7-8 girls 

place fourth 
The Texico junior high 7-8 bask-

etball girls B team lost to Texico's A 
team 38-18 Feb. 4 in the Floyd 
Tournament. They placed fourth in 
the tourney. 

Scoring for Texico were Amy 
Chadwick, 10 points, 4 rebounds and 
8 steals; Krystalla Cross, 2 points, 
12 rebounds and 1 steal; Ysdria 
Martinez, 2 points and 3 rebounds; 
Leslie Cox, 4 points, 5 rebounds and 
1 steal. 

Texico lost to Elida 43-8 Feb. 5. 
Scoring for Texico were Amy 

Chadwick, 6 points, 5 rebounds and 1 
steal; Leslie Cox, 2 points and 5 
rebounds. 

• 
• 

Coach Roy King; middle row, from 
left, Lynna Hunter, Tasha Rucker, 
Konni Warmuth, Leslie Cox; front 
row, from left, Krystalla Cross, 
Ysdria Martinez, Amy Chadwick, 
Denise Gonzales. Not shown is 
Penny Pierce. 

• The Texico Junior High basketball 
: girls had an outstanding season. 
• They finished with a record of 13-2. 
• They are, back row, from left, 

Mellisa Montano, Valerie Caval- 
lero, Jennifer Williams, Esperanza 

:Estrada, Jennifer Gentry and 

Texico girls take second 
points, 3 rebounds, ana I steal. 

Texico's record is 13-2. 

Helen Meissner, Alice Head, 
Nancy Thompson, Effie Smith. 
Fairy Stovall, Dolly Spell, Ora 
Roberts, Winnie Murphy, 
Joyce Heath, Cordelia Cochran 
and Bertie Hendrix all enjoy 
Ceramics Class. We have 
ceramics every Wednesday 
taught by Gladys Young. 
Gladys has been coming 
weekly for a year. 

Gladys' husband, Richard, 
helps carry the boxes of green-
ware or objects decorated 
ready to be fired back and forth 
to the car never complaining of 
the extra chores we ask of him. 

Gladys and Richard are from 
Pittsburgh, Pa. They have 
lived in Farwell 	years. 
They have 5 children and 9 
grandchildren. 

They find a great deal of 
pleasure from ceramics and 
have many beautiful pieces in 
their home to show for their 
efforts. 

Gladys has taught us how to 
clean greenware, apply glazes 
or paint flowers, trees, scenes 
and different designs. We made 
78 coffee cups, one for each of 
the residents for Christmas 
presents using a color and 
glaze safe for food containers 
so we could use them if we so 
desired. We have made flower 
vases, bells, boxes, animals, all 
sorts of things. 

We learn to do something 
new each week. 

Thank you Gladys and 
Richard. 

You are a Treasure. 

The Texico junior high 7-8 basket-
:ban girls A team defeated Texico 
:"B" team 38-18 Feb. 4 in the Floyd 
Tournament. They took second 
:place. 
: Scoring for Texico were Valarie 
:Cavalier°, 2 points, 7 rebounds, and 

ett assists; Esperanza Estrada, 14 
.points, 7 rebounds, 2 steals and 2 
assists; Mellisa Montano, 4 points, 5 
:rebounds, and 1 steal; Tasha Ruck-
er, 2 points, 1 rebound, and 1 assist; 
:and Denise Gonzales, 2 points, 2 
febounds, 2 steals and 2 assists; and 
'envy Pierce, 14 points, 6 rebounds, 
t steals and 1 assist. 

Texico lost to Floyd 34-19 Feb. 5. 
Scoring for Texico were Jennifer 
entry, 3 points and 2 rebounds; 

litlennifer Williams, 6 points, 3 re-
bounds, and 4 steals; Cavallero, 8 
points, 3 rebounds, 4 steals and 9 
assists; Esperanza Estrada, 2 

iltweitsge diestases 
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MEALS ON WHEELS 
Noon meal can be delivered 

to your door. For further in-
formation contact Farwell 
Convalescent Center. This pro-
gram is for elderly, handi-
capped and temporary ill-
nesses. 

481-9027 

There were four marriage li-
censes issued during the past week 

Abby the Parmer County Clerk's 
'1r  office. 

Marriage licenses were issued to 
Michael Don Read and Cindy Diane 
Chesher; Elvis Ray Wright and 
Diana Rene Gustin; Will Ray 
Ritchie and Tammy Kay Young; 
and Timothy T. Allison and Micky J. 
Wood. 
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On behalf of the 4-H 
and FFA youngsters of 
Parmer County, we 
wish to Thank the 
Buyers who purchased 
and/or contributed to 

ICalves, Lambs and 
Swine at the Annual 

FRIONA Tommy Tatum 
Dee Willard 
W&W Cattle 

Randy Thomas 

Tide Products 

FARWELL 
Jim Berry CPA 
Capitol Food 
Circle D Feed 
Farwell Abstract 
Farwell Championship Club 
Farwell Gin Co. 
Farwell Insurance Agency 
Helton Oil 
Lovelace Oil Co. 
Security State Bank 
Sherley-Anderson-Pitman 
Sherley-Anderson Grain - Lariat 

Tide Products 
Williams Fertilizer 
Worley Mills 

.10 

BOVINA 
Agri Speyer Inc. 
Bovine Fuel Supply 
Bovine Pump Co. Inc. 

Charles Oil Co. 
Clayton Farm Center 

James Clayton 
First State Bank 
Kerby Welding Service 
O.B. Lawlis Gin Co. 
Parmer Co. Spraying 
Pioneer Seed - Tommy Williams 

Sherley Grain 
Sudderth Contracting 

Widner Hog Farm 

41 Parmer County Jr. 
Livestock Show. 

OTHER TOWNS 
A&M Farm Supply - Clovis 
Bailey County Propane - Mulesone 
B&C Kitchen - Muleshoe 
Big Country Ford - Clovis 
Caviness Packing Co. - Hereford 
Citizen's Bank of Clovis Texico Branch 
James Crane Tire - Muleshoe 
Dent & Co. - Muleshoe 
Ellis Funeral Home - Muleshoe 
Estacado Industries - Dimmitt 
Farmer's Co-op Elevators - Muleshoe 
Farmers Spraying - Muleshoe 
Federal Land Bank - Muleshoe 
First National Bank - Muleshoe 
Five Area Telephone - Muleshoe 

Fry & Cox - Muleshoe 
Storm Gerhart - Grady 
Robert Green - Muleshoe 
Great Plains Chemical - Clovis 
David Hamil - Sterling, Colo. 
Higginbotham Lumber - Muleshoe 
Howell Quarter Horses - Dimmitt 
Hurst Farm Supply - Lorenzo 
Irrigation Pump & Power - Muleshoe 
Leal's Restaurant - Muleshoe 
Charles Lenau Lumber - Muleshoe 
Leo's Blacksmith - Muleshoe 
Robert Lindsey - Plainview 
Lo-Jo Corp. - Shallowater 
Longhorn Spraying - Muleshoe 
Charles Luedtke - Paducah 
Morrison Oil - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe Animal Clinic - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe - Electric - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe Fertilizer - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe Gin Co. - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe Livestock Auction - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe Motor - Muleshoe 
Muleshoe State Bank - Muleshoe 
Poarch Bros. - Hereford 
Neff Preston - Lubbock 
Curtis Schaefer - Clarendon 
Shur-Gro Liquid Feed - Hereford 
Don Tardy Insurance - Hereford 
T&D Commodities - Clovis 
Taylor Evans - Muleshoe 
Texas Sesame - Muleshoe 
Valley Sprinkler - Muleshoe 
West Texas Rural - Hereford 
Wiedebush & Company - Muleshoe 
Wilson Appliance - Muleshoe 

LAZBUDDIE 
Clay's Corner Gln, Inc. 
Foster Fertilizer 
Gailmon Pay Loader 
Gene Paul Jarman 
Larry Jesko 
Wayne Jesko 
J.P. Family 
Darrel Mason 
Ncrth Lazbuddle Gin 
S-E-L Pig Sale 
Seaton Bros. 
Seaton Hog Boosters 
Sherley-Anderson 

Benger Alr Park 
Leroy Berend 
A.L. Black 

Black Grain Co. 
Brown Equipment 
W.D. Buske 
Jerry Cass 
Kenyth Cass 
Cattle Town Inc. 
Gene Ellis 
Ethridge-Spring Agency 
EXCEL Corp. 
Farm Bureau 
Friona Feed Yard 
Friona Ford Sales Inc. 
Friona Industries 
Friona Livestock Boosters 
Friona Star 
Friona State Bank 
George Fry 
Gellman Enterprise 
Herring Implement 
HI Pro Feeds 
Hub Grain Co. 
Phillip Johnson 
Dale Milner 
Raymond Milner 
Parmer Co. Implement 
Parmer Co. Veterinary Clinic 
Pioneer Seed - Dale Milner 
Potts Auction Service 
Potts Manufacturing 
Mike Relthmayer 
Raymond Schueler 
Shirley-Anderson - Rhea 

I
I

We also wish to thank Parmer County Young 
Farmers, the division superintendents and 

assistants. Also, all of the vo-ag teachers, the 

Judges, county agent, members of the Friona 

4 

 FFA, Parmer County Farm Bureau, Friona 
Young Homemakers, Friona Star for their help 

' and contributions. Also, special thanks to 
auctioneers, Houston Bartlett, Larry Potts and 
Don Genes, Friona industries for printing sale 

I
bills, Virginia Cleveland, Donna Schueler, 
Vickie Copley, Mickle Cochran and Shirley 

i
Schueler for typing, all of the FFA Sweethearts 
and Plowgirts, the clerks, bookkeepers, Keith 
Black Enterprises for bookkeeping, and others 

1 helping in the ring and all those who assisted 
- the show in any way. 

THIS PUBLIC SERVICE MESSAGE 
IS BEING SPONSORED BY: 

I PARMER COUNTY JUNIOR 
40,  
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HIRING for full time and part time 
positions - Farwell Dairy Queen. 

51-tfnc 

1951 and 1949 CHEVY PICKUPS. 
1951 has butane system. Use 2 to 
build 1. Call 225-6393. 	23-2tp 

EASY ASSEMBLY WORK! $600.00 
per 100. Guaranteed payment. No 
Experience/No Sales. Details send 
self-addressed stamped envelope: 
ELAN VITAL - 6431, 3418 Enterprise 
Road, Ft. Pierce, Fla. 33482. 24-4tp 

STOCK SHOW KIDS!!! 
Pictures are in of all animals 
that made the sale. See them 
at... 

STITCHES AND SCENTS 
in Main - Friona 

Tuesday thru Friday 
9:30 - 5:30 

Saturday, 10';00 - 2:00 
19-1tc 

e 	 
Own your own Jean-Sportswear, 
Ladies Apparel, Childrens, Large 
Size, Petite, Combination Store, 
Maternity, Accessories. Jordache, 
Chic, Lee, Levi, E Z Street, Izod, 
Esprit, Tomboy, Calvin Klein, Ser-
gio Valente, Evan Picone, Liz Clai-
borne, Members Only, Gasoline, 
Healthtex, Over 1000 others. $13,300 
to $24,900 inventory, training, fix-
tures, grand opening etc. Can open.  
15 days. Mr. Loughlin (612) 888-6555. 

REPORT CHILD ABUSE 

CALL 1-800-252-5400 
• 
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4 	NEW RELEASES 
4 	Teen Wolf 	 4 
4 	My Science Project 	4 
4 VIDEO CENTER  
4 2i2 Ave. A - Farwell 
4 	 481-9011  

• 
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ADVISO DE NOMBRES DE 
CANDIDATOS PARA CARGO 
PUBLICO, DESIGNACION DE 

LOCALES PARA VOTAR Y 
MIEMBROS DE LA JUNTA 
DIRECTIVA DE PRECINTO 

Ciudad de Texico 

Con respecto a la eleccion munic-
ipal regular que se llevara a cabo el 
4 de marzo de 1986 y de acuerdo con 
SS 3-8-30 NMSA 1978: 

A. Por medio de la presente se da 
noticia que los siguientes elec. 
tores calificados son candidatos 
para puestos publicos de la 
Ciudad de Texico. 

Los nombres de los candidatos 
aparecen en la orden que fig-
uraran en la balota segun de- . 
terminado por sorteo. 

1. Para el puesto de Alcalde por 
un termino de cuatro anos: 
John R. Hadley 
Max L. Carter 

2. Para el puesto de consejal por 
un termino de cuatro anos: 
(Vote para 2) 

Doyal G. LaRue 
Lewis Cooper 
Nathan L. Tharp 

B. Por medio de la presente se da 
noticia que las seguientes locals 
para votar se usaran para la 411 
eleccion municipal regular que 
se llevara a cabo el 4 de marzo 
de 1986. 

1. Votantes en el Precinto 16 
dentro del lindero municipal 
votaran en Texico edificio 
comunidad, 417 Wheeler. 

i 	BIG NICK MACHINERY 
BOVINA, TEXAS 

238-1614 	Night 238-1450 
,...... 	.' NON 

(41111fe 

PIERCE 
CHARLOTTE PIERCE, 

BROKER 
400 Craig Street 

Texico, N.M. 
[5051482-9188 

REAL ESTATE 

481-9188 . 
TEXICO, N.M. 

Fully Licensed 
In New Mexico & Texas 

Accepting listings on mobile homes under Mfg. Housing Div. Broker 
License No. 22. 

central heat, but low utility bills. 

TEXICO - LARGE 3 bedroom home in good condition, which may 
remain on leased tract of land, 1001 x100', or moved. Will sell as a , 
bargain! 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY 
Popular drive-in restaurant on Highway 67-84 through Texico, 
including business and real estate, and may also include double-wide 
mobile home. If double-wide not desired, it will be moved. 

FARWELL-BROKER-OWNER HAS FOR SALE Large home 604 2nd 
St., Farwell, Has 3 bedrooms, separage den with fireplace that could 
be fourth bedroom, 134 baths, attached garage and carport, backyard 
fenced and many extras. Recently repainted inside and out and in good 
condition. Current VA appraisal $34,000 - You can buy for $30,000 if you 
qualify for conventional, FHA, or VA loan. 

TEXICO - Good investment property, as well as a recently remodeled 
home! Mobile home park with five spaces, and 2-bedroom home in 
good condition. Located at 105 Lamar Street, Texico. PRICE 
REDUCED!! OWNER READY TO SELL! 

TEXICO - 3-bedroom home in good location, close to school, at 307 
Lamar, Texico. 

FARWELL - MOBILE HOME PARK equipped for 6 mobile homes, 201 
7th Street, Farwell. ALSO A GOOD INVESTMENT! 

MOBILE HOMES 

1983 14' x 56' Esprit mobile home, in excellent condition. Small equity 
and assume loan. 509 South Garwood, Texico. 

BEAUTIFUL - 14'x44' Manatee Mobile Home, total electric, with 
refrigerated air, which would be perfect for single, couple or retiree. 
Luxury interior, at price below appraisal! Let Broker show you this 
one, as you must see the interior to really appreciate it! 211 - 7th St., 
Farwell. 

FARM AND RANCH 

A beautiful 160 acres irrigated, two 8 inch wells, with house and barn, 
east of Lariat in excellent water area. 

*** 

PRICE REDUCED FOR QUICK SALE - 600 acres, good dry land, with 
wheat crop 6 miles north and 5 miles east of Broadview, N.M. Owner 
says sell. 

320 acres, irrigated, lays good, 3 wells and barn. Owner says sell 
immediately. East of Bovina. 

••* 

177 acres, with Zimmatic sprinkler near Lazbuddie, good water area. 
Owner says sell. 

••• 

120 acres irrigated, 8 inch well, lays good, southwest of Texico. $19,000 
to $25,000 down. Owner will finance balance at 10 percent. 

We Specialize in Estates 
••••Weil••••ii WM% 01  woad loWsWoOW•WW weilanoi•••••••••••••••••••iiii•••••• 

SAVING Is GREAT 
INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 
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The Classifieds 
CAKES by INA 

Order Your Next 
Special Occasion Cake 

By Calling 
Texico 482-9455 

Hours: 8 a.m.-3 p.m. [MST] 

CUSTOM-MADE QUILTING and 
hand-crafted gift items. Contempo 
Quilts, 5171 2  Main St., Clovis. 
763-6881. 	 22-8tc 

Legal notice 
STATEMENT OF 

NONDISCRIMINATION 

2. For clerks in Precinct 16: 
Theodora Rojas, 
Bernice Thigpen 

color, or national origin, be exclud-
ed from participation in, be denied 
the benefits of, or be otherwise sub-
jected to discrimination in the con-
duct of its program and the op-
eration of its facilities. Under the 
Assurance, this organization is com-
mitted not to discriminate against 
any person on the ground of race, 
color or national origin in its poli-
cies and practices relating to appli-
cations for service or any other 
policies and practices relating to 
treatment of beneficiaries and par-
ticipants including rate, conditions 
and extension of service, use of any 
of its facilities, attendance at and 
participation in any meetings of 
beneficiaries and participants in the 
conduct of the operations of this 
organizations." 

• • 
• 

D. Notice is hereby given that a Pre- -.4 
cinct Board Election school will = 
will be held on the 26th day of = 
February, 1986 at the Texico City : 
Hall in Texico, New Mexico. The : 
school will begin at 2:00 PM, 
MST. The school is open to the: 
public. 

Dated this 4th day of February,'..-: 
1986. 

Political 

Announcements 

"Five Area Telephone Cooperative, 
Inc., has filed with the Federal 
Government a Compliance Assur-
ance in which it assures the Rural 
Electrification Administration that 
it will comply fully with all re-
quirements of Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964, and the Rule and 
Regulations of the Department of 
Agriculture issued thereunder, to 
the end that no person in the United 
States shall, on the ground of race, 

$••••••••••••••••••••••$ 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

• The State Line Tribune is 
• authorized to note the following 
• 
• persons are on the ballot in the 
• Parmer County Primary • 
• 
• election: 
• DEMOCRATIC 
• 
• COUNTY JUDGE 
• Porter Roberts • 
• [re-election] 
• 
• 
• DISTRICT JUDGE 
• 
• Jack Young 
• 
• [re-election] 
• 
• • COUNTY CLERK 
• 	Bonnie Warren 
• 
• [re-election] 
• 
• 
• COMMISSIONER 
• 
• Precinct 4 
• Raymond McGehee 
• 
• [re-election] 
• 
• 

DISTRICT CLERK 

• 
Marjorie Watkins 

t (re-election) 

COUNTY TREASURER 
• Anne Norton 
• 
• 
• JUSTICE OF THE PEACE • 
• 	Albert Smith 
• 
• [re-election] 
• 
• Billy "Shorty" Hughes 
• 
• 
• 
4•••••••••••••••••••••••• 

Signed: Marie Christian 
Municipal Clerk 

Call your local used cow 

dealer for 1-day-a-week 

free dead stock removal. 

Call 505/163-5513 collect 

or 1-800-858-4384. 

Published in the State Line Tribune.  
February, 14 and February 21, 1986. 

5 DRAWER CHESTS 
Just received 21 chests in dark or 
light finish. Only $38.90. Easy terms 
available. May be seen at Furniture 
Liquidators, 2300 Mabry Drive, 
Clovis. Open to the public Mon.-Sat. 
10 a.m. to 6 p.m. Sun. 1 p.m. to 6 
p.m. 	 24-tfnc 

• 
• 
• • 
• • • 
• 
• • • 
• • • • • 
• 
• 
• • • • • 
• • 
• • 
• 
• • 
• 
• • • • 
• 
• • • • 
• 

CADILLAC SEDAN DeVille. Mint 
condition. Loaded. Call 225-6393. 

23-2tp 

LATHE AND STUCCO WORK. New 
jobs or patch work. Professional 
and free esimates. Call 806-965-2871. 

24-4tc 

MEM 

"Any person who believes himself, 
or any specific class of individuals, 
to be subjected by this organization 
to discrimination prohibited by Title 
VI of the Act and the Rules and 
Regulations issued thereunder may, 
by himself, or a representative, file 
with the Secretary of Agriculture, 
Washington, D.C. 20250; or the 
Rural Electrification Administra-
tion, Washington, D.C. 20250; or this 
organization; or all; a written com-
plaint. Such complaint must be filed 
not later than 90 days after the 
alleged discrimination, or by such 
later date to which the Secretary of 
Agriculture or the Rural Electrifi-
cation Administration extends the 
time for filing. Identity of com-
plaints will be kept confidential 
except to the extent necessary to 
carry out the purpose of the Rules 
and Regulations." 

•, 	 • 

';',/ NEW SCHAFFER DISK PARTS "9.?  

A.W.S. & S.A.M.E. Certified 

i

13 Acres Machinery. 17 New-Used 
Tractors; Used Tractor/Combine 

i Parts; 3-7700 JD Diesels, 9 Used 

i

Grain Drills. JD 700 Grinder/ 
Mixer Hyd. 6 yard Eversman 
Scraper. #12 Cat .Maintainer. 2070 

1 

 Schwaltz loader, JD 158 & 148 
Loaders, 3010 JD Diesel with Dual 
Loader. / / / 

: rwietat s 

♦ i 	
ACE WELDING SERVICEi 

• 

I 

I I  

"Reliable Service In 
Texico-Farwell 
At Fair Prices" 

SOFAS, SOFAS, SOFAS 
New shipment of Sofas from major 
manufacturers overruns. All at 
specially reduced prices. Assorted 
styles and fabrics. Some with 
chairs, some with love seats. Sofa, 
love seat combination, tuxedo style, 
lush thick cushions, generously 
padded with quality. Both pieces 
only $288. Easy terms available. 
May be seen at Furniture Liqui-
dators, 2300 Mabry Drive, Clovis. 
Open to public Mon.-Sat. 10 a.m. to 6 
p.m. Sun. 1 p.m. to 6 p.m. 	24-tfnc 

E.L. MYERS 
482-9040 

Farm Repairs 	Clotheslines 
Carports/Storage Buildings 

Swingsets 
We Have A Portable Servicej 

Published in the State Line Tribune 
February 14, 1986. 

REALTORS udderth Realty, Inc. 
Drawer 887 - 109 5th St., Farwell, Tx. 79325 

Phone 806/481-3288 

NOTICE OF NAMES OF 
CANDIDATES FOR OFFICE 

DESIGNATION OF 
POLLING PLACES AND 

PRECINCT BOARD MEMBERS 

CITY OF TEXICO 

In connection with the regular mu-
nicipal election to be held on March 
4, 1986, and pursuant to SS 3-8-30 
NMSA 1978: 

A. Notice is hereby given that the 
following qualified electors are 
candidates for public office of the 
City of Texico. 

The candidates' names are listed 
in the order that they will appear 
on the ballot determined by the 
drawing by lot. 

1. For the office of Mayor for a 
four year term: 

John R. Hadley 
Max L. Carter 

2. For the office of Councilman 
for a four year term: 
(vote for 2) 

Doyal G. LaRue 
Lewis Cooper 
Nathan L. Tharp 

B. Notice is hereby given that the 
following polling place shall be 
used for the conduct of the 
regular municipal election to be 
held on March 4, 1986. 

1. Voters in Precinct 16 within 
the municipal boundary shall 
vote at the Texico Community 
Building, 417 Wheeler. 

2. Voters in the absent voter 
precinct will vote at the office 
of the City Clerk. 

C. The following Precinct Board 
members have been appointed: 

1. For judge in Precinct 16: Mae 
W. Stone 

RONALD BYRD, GRI 
LICENSED BROKER 
FARWELL, TEXAS 

Office (806) 481-3846 

Mobile (505) 761-0849 Licensed in Texas, New Mexico and Oklahoma 

Certified Appraisers 
Daren Sudderth, Broker 

640 acres on pavement in Oklahoma Lane area. 4 electric 
sprinklers, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home. 60x100 metal barn. Excellent 
water area, four 8" wells and one 6" well. Call for details. J.B. Sudderth, Broker 

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 

2 bedroom, 1 bath stucco house and stucco storage building with 
carport. Near Farwell to be moved. $12,000. 

• • • 

Nice 3 bedroom, I bath home with single car garage and small storage 
building. 506 First Street, Farwell. Makes an excellent starter home. 

* 

Get the family out of town and into this ideal country home on 5 acres. 
Spacious 5 bedroom, 3 bath brick with garage and carport. Lots of 
storage, out buildings, barn, corrals, fences, and on highway. See this 
one today. Northeast of Farwell. 

Approximately 1700 sq. ft. home in Farwell. 3 bedroom 13,4 bath home 
on corner lot. Fenced back yard, large storage building and storm 
cellar. Priced for immediate sale. 

in* 
160 acres in Pleasant Hill area, has one good 8 inch well, lays good. This 
owner has excellent terms on this farm. Call for details. 

• • • 

Approximately 540 acres next to Farwell city limits, 3 electric 
sprinklers, three 8 inch wells. Lays excellent. Owner financing. Priced 
for immediate sale. Call for details. 

• *• 

2. Votantes en el precinto de 
votantes ausentes votaran en la 
oficina del la Escribanoa 
Municipal. 

Very nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath, stucco house in Farwell. Nice yard with 
sprinkler system. Cinder block fenced back yard. Located in good 
neighborhood near churches and post office. 

* 

C. Los siguientes miembros del 
Cuerpo Directivo del Precinto 
han sido nombrados: 

Excellent existing Agri-business opportunity. Would make an ideal 
family operation. Located in the Farwell-Bovina-Oklahoma Lane area. 
Would trade for home or land as part down payment. 

1. Para el juez en el Precinto: 
16: Mae Stone 

• • 4. 2. Para escribanosas en el Pre- 
cinto 16: Teodora Rojas, 
Bernice Thigpen 

D. Por medio de la presente se da 
noticia que se llevara a cabo una 
"Escuela" sobre la Election del: 
Cuerpo Directive del Precinto el-
dia 26 de febrero de 1986, en el: 
Texico City Hall en Texico,: 
Nuevo Mexico. La "escuela" - 
empezara a las 2:00 P.M. La 
"escuela" esta abierta al pub- - 
lico. 	 4. I 

Fechado este dia 4th de febrero de 
1986. 

Nice 3 bedroom, 134 bath, brick, single car garage, fenced backyard 
and good neighborhood. See to appreciate. 

in • 

Good 50'x150' lot with hookups for mobile home. Located on Loop in 
Farwell. 

* 

Excellent starter home or for retired couple. Remodeled and newly 
painted I bedroom, 1 bath, living room and kitchen. Priced for 
immediate sell. Owner will finance. 

• 4,  

Very nice brick commercial building, glass front, some Fixtures. 
Adaptable to most kinds of businesses. Excellent location on main 
highway in Farwell. 

* • • 

Firmado: Marie Christian 
( Escribano Municipal) 

Published in the State Line Tribune 
February 14, and February 21, 1986. 

Muleshoe refuge 
open house set 

1 

Feb. 14 with a population of 100,000 
or more. In February, 1980 more 
than 250,000 cranes were counted on 
the refuge. This year the number of 
cranes may be in the range of 40,000 do 
or 60,000 due to the very mild 
winter. 

In addition to observing the sand-
hill crams, ducks, prairie dogs, and 
other wildlife, visitors will have an 
opportunity to see five of the new 
wayside exhibits that 'should be 
installed along refuge roads and,  
sandhill crane display in the office/- . 
visitor center. A film on the Na-
tional Wildlife Refuge System will • . 
be shown each hour on the hour. aa  

The Muleshoe National Wildlife 
Refuge will host an open house on 
Feb. 15 and 16. The refuge office will 
be open from 10 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
Saturday and 1 p.m. to 6 p.m. 
Sunday. 

The refuge is hosting the open 
house to celebrate the refuge's 50th 
anniversary. Muleshoe, the oldest 
refuge in Texas, was established 
October 24, 1935. The open house 
was delayed until February to coin-
cide with the normal peak of the 
sandhill crane migration and so new 
exhibits could be installed. 

The latest sandhill crane count 
was 36,000 on Feb. 3. The peak 
spring migration is usually about 



DON'T WAIT BUY NOW 
WHY? 

Have Your Income Taxes Figured 

FREE 
And Then Use Your Refund As A 

Down Payment NOM 
(This Offer Is Good Only On Approved New And Used Vehicle Sales) 

A.P.R. Financing 
On Selected Cars 

„Dad Trucks From 
-Fiord Motor 00. 

■ • 

Don't Be Misled 

FREE 
5 Year Or 60,000 Mlle 
Warranty From The 
Ford Motor Co. 

86' Rangers 86' Bronco II'S On Any Interest Rate 
That Is Not Nationally 
Advertised or 
Backed By A 
National 
Company. 

1=111.111111M11.111111111.111101 
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1985 
F-250 Super Cab 
SAVE $4500 

Dual Wheel-4xl-Diesel-Tilt-AutomatIc-
Power Steering-Power Windows-Power 
Doors-AM-FM Cassette-Crulse. 

• 1985 
Ranger 

Extra Clean 

1985 
F-150 XLT 

One owner 

1985 
Bronco Ii 

SAVE $3000 
Blue V6-Automatic Air Power 
Steering AM FM• Wire Wheel Covers. 

Step Blue and While Loaded Chronic 
Bumper Running Boards. 

Red and White-AUtomallc-Power 
Steering Air-AM-FM. 

1984 

F-150 Super Can 

Ford [Wave Car 

Loaded Short Wheel Base .  

1981 

$4,995 
1978 

CLT 9000 
Extra Clean 

(4)1974 
4300 Series 
International 

Twin Screw Tractors 
Silver-Axe-4 Speed Power Steering AM 
FM Cassette-Speed Control Custom 
Shell 01,000Miles 

Twin Screw-10 Speed-22 Ft. Bed-30 Ton 
Hoist-New Engine. 

13 Speed 3S0 Cumming Engine Have 
Recordsof Miami 

Out 01 Town Customers May Inquire By Calling Collect 505-762-4427. 

Th. prima ... the musics ... tIi. satisfaction. 

HAGELGANTZ 
BIG COUNTRY FORD C? SUBARU 

ziloo MABRY DRIVE 762 442,7 

Please Attend 
Church Services 

Geed Wilt Spastisk Wisatett 

4 Texico. 
Pastor - Frank Ancira 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. MST 
Worship - 10:45 a.m. MST 
Training Union - 5:30 p.m. MST 
Worship - 6:30 p.m. MST 

Fatal 
Rot Baptist Ckiack 
Bro. Pat Riley 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 7 p.m. 

Rowed Cluack 06 avast Texico 
Ames* 4 God Cluack 

Rev. Karl Hahn 
Sunday School - 9:15 a.m. MST 
Worship - 10:15 a.m. & 6 p.m. MST 
Wednesday - 7 p.m. MST 

Bro. Virgil Fiske 
Bible Class - Sunday, 10 a.m. 
Worship - 10:50 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Wednesday - 7:30 p.m. 

Sax gen Coats& &ark 
Texts" 

Fr. Gordon Blank 
Sunday Mass - 9 a.m. MST 
Wednesday - 7 p.m. MST 
Confessions Before & After Mass 

Texico. Rust Baptist Mit& Hasstfix Wattetiat 
Unite& WeIluulist Mack 

Rev. Steve Stephens 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. 
Monday Prayer Breakfast - 7 a.m. 

Rev. Joel Horne 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. MST 
Worship 10:45 a.m. & 6:30 p.m. MST 
Wednesday - 6:30 p.m. MST 

St. Elekit's Lutketuut Mack 
Lola 

Rev. Mac Bearss 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Worship - 10:30 a.m. 

Oh/Akan Lan 
Baptist Cluack 

Interim Pastor: Strauss Atkinson 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Wednesday - 7 p.m. 

Wiled Pula/Wag Clued( 
Tutu 

Pastor Raymond Parks 
Sunday School - 9 a.m. MST 
Worship - 10:15 a.m. & 6 p.m. MST 
Wednesday - 6:30 p.m. MST 
Thursday - 6:30 p.m. MST 

Kau 21g1t1 Baptist Mack Oldakesta Lan 

Wetksdist alma Pastor - Thomas Spikes 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday - 7:30 p.m. 

Rev. Clark Williams 
Worship Service - 9 a.m. 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 

Tempte Baptist Clack 

Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Wednesday - 7 p.m. 

Latta Cklack 06 &clot 
Sam Billingsley - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship -1 /4 11 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Wednesday - 7:30 p.m. winter 

Summer 8 p.m. 

%maid Riff 
Baptist Cluack 

Rev. Jack Moore 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. MST 
Worship - 10:30 a.m. & 6:30 p.m. 
Church Training - 5:30 p.m. MST 
Wednesday - 6:30 p.m. MST 

CaIvami Wisaiatatti 
Baptist Mack Faucet 
Rev. Leslie Dudley 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 7 p.m. 

j

74e4 (lea eureal. a #1044fryted 4 titat dettheada: 

Farwell Insurance 	 Lovelace Oil 	 Kelly Green Seeds 

Sherley-Anderson-Pitman 	Twin Oaks Psi Design 

Capitol Food 	 The Beauty Box 	 Worley Mills 

West Texas Rural Telephone Cooperative 

farmer's Cooperative Elevator - Muleshoe 	Five Area Telephone Cooperative 
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Basketball Action!!! 

Texico junior high boys go 15-0 
Texico played San Jon for the 

championship. Texico won 24-18. 
"The guys played a super game. 

It was one of our best if not our best 
efforts of the year. All of the guys 
played super. Before the game I 
decided to play a box-and-one de-
fense against their best player who 
was averaging 16 to 18 points a 
game. 

"I gave Bill Daniel the respons-
ibility of stopping him. Daniel didn't 

Powell and McDaniel had 4 assists 
along with 4 steals each. It was just 
a super effort from the whole 
team," said Littlejohn. 

"I felt like the team improved in 
every aspect of the game from the 
beginning of the year. They worked 
hard and paid attention. I felt like 
these guys not only played the game 
but seemed to understand it also. 
Just a great bunch of guys to work 
with." 

let him get the ball out about five or 
six times the whole game, and held 
him to just 5 points with 2 of those in 
the last few seconds when the game 
had already been decided. It was 
just an outstanding defensive effort. 
Besides playing good defense, 
Daniel pulled down 8 rebounds. 

"We were led in scoring by 
Rogers with 13 and Powell with 9 
and McDaniel with 2. Longo and 
Rogers and 6 rebounds apiece while 

aThe Texico Junior High basketball 
boys were undefeated. Their final 
record is 15-0. They are, back row, 
from left, Coach Michael Littlejohn, 
Jason Longo, Brian Rogers, Larry 
Powell and Bill Daniel; middle row, 

r ep 
VROM cunD  

• lid )) odor- 

from left, Mark Holmes, Hector 
Orozco, Pete Fuentes, Tony Vega 
and Jaime Estrada; and front row, 
from left, Wesley Farmer, Benjy 
McDaniel, Joe Pierce and Luis 
Ortega. 

Bill: Happy Valentine's Day. Thank you for 

being a part of me and my life. We love you. 

Lon, Sharon and the kids 
Farwell picture unclear 

Happy Valentine's Day! Noni & Charlie, we love you. lezlie & lance 

Violets are blue, Roses are red, Nobody could ever have, A! husband and daddy like you. 

Love you, Teresa & Lee 

Barbara Young from Cal: 
Just a Happy Valentine's Day to my lovely and talented wife who I love very much. 

Happy Valentine's Day to Gwen and Ed Corn, Clay, Christi, Charla and Clint, La Nelle and Bill Polly, 

J.J. and Tara, Loy and Joe McClellan, Judy and Johnny, Tammy and Dennis Willard, Joshua, Jeremy 

and Amber. We love you, Granny and Gramps 

The Texico junior high basketball 
boys won first place in the Floyd 
Tournament Feb. 2-5. 

Texico's record is 15-0. 
Texico junior high boys first 

defeated House 39-27. 
Scoring for Texico were Brian 

Rogers, 12; Larry Powell, 9 and 
Benjy McDaniel with 10. Rebound-
ing for Texico were Jason Longo, 
11; Brian Rogers, 8 and Larry 
Powell with 9. Steals for Texico 
were by McDaniel, 4; Powell, 3 and 
Rogers with 3; assists were Powell, 
6 and McDaniel with 3. 

"We played in spurts. We would 
look real good for a few minutes 
then we would lose it for a minute or 
two. But overall we are playing 
well. Everyone contributed in dif-
ferent areas," said Coach Michael 
Littlejohn. 

Texico defeated Ft. Sumner in the 
semi-finals 35-30. 

Scoring for Texico were Rogers, 
10 points, 8 rebounds; Powell, 11 
points, 5 assists and 3 steals; 
Bill Daniels, 6 points, 4 rebounds, 3 
steals; Longo, 6 points, and 12 
rebounds; McDaniel, 2 points, 3 
assists and 5 steals. 

"A very physical game. We took 
an early 8 point lead then got a little 
lethargic and led only by 1 point at 
halftime. We came out in the second 
half and traded baskets with Ft. 
Sumner with neither team leading 
by more than 3 points. 

"But with just a little over a 
minute left Bill Daniels hit two free 
throws to give us a 4 point lead. 
After Daniels rebounded their 
missed shot he was fouled again and 
made two more free throws for a 6 
point lead. Larry Powell converted 
one of two free throws for our final 
point," said Coach Michael Little-
john. 

Play, Inc., 
results listed 

In last week's Play, Inc., action: 
Wolves 24, Raiders 20. Scoring for 
the Wolves were Pepe Gonzales, 10; 
Kelvin Gooden, 6; Matthew Wil-
liams, 4, and Jon Crouch, 4. 

To get into the tie, Farwell had to 
beat Kress Tuesday, which it did, 
75-49. 

Scoring for Farwell were Roy 
Perales, 20; David Woods, 17; Jody 
Ketcherside and Danny Rubio, 8 
each; Jeff Actkinson, 7; Jesse An-
zaldua, 5; Boney Nicolas, 4; Steve 
Lara, Damon George and Robbie 
White, 2 each. 

"It was a super game for us. We 
had to win it. Hopefully we are 
playing our best ball of the year 
right now. Perales and Woods 
played very well offensive. Rubio 
and Anzaldua rebounded well. 
Ketcherside had a real good floor 
game. Every kid who suited up 
scored. I'm looking forward to 
playing the winner whether it be 
Lazbuddie or Happy," said Coach 
Larry Gregory. 

Farwell has a 4-4 district record 
and 10-17 overall. 

It won't be decided until Monday 
whether the Farwell Steers boys 

&basketball team will be in the state 
erplayoffs. 

The divisional play ended with a 
three-way tie for second place be-
tween Farwell, Happy and Laz-
buddie. 

Happy and Lazbuddie will play at 
7 p.m. Feb. 14 at Hereford. Farwell 
will play the winner. 

If Happy wins Feb. 14, Farwell 
will play at Wayland or Olton at 7 

a...p.m. Monday. If Lazbuddie wins, 
arwell will play at Muleshoe at 7 

p.m. Monday. 

Texico variety 
show planned' 

The Texico High School yearbook 
staff will present its annual variety 
show Feb. 15 at 7 p.m. (MST) in the 
Educational Complex. 

The theme of this year's show will 
Abe "Catch a Falling Star." 

Students and guest entertainers 
from throughout the area will per-
form. 

The recipients of the special 
honors for 1986, most popular class 
favorite and Mr. and Miss THS, will 
be revealed at the conclusion. 

The admission is $2 for adults and 
$1 for students. 

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

"When Understanding Is Needed Most" 
Prince & Manana - Clovis 

Ph. 763-5541 



Soil Conservation Service agreed 
with Donham and added: "We 
really appreciate the turnout, con-
sidering the foggy weather and 
snow. There seems to be lots of 
interest in conservation tillage." 

"We hope to give people ideas to 
take back and try. They may have 
to make some changes or varia-
tions, but there are new things to 
try," said Donham. 

"Of course, we'd also like people 
to know that they can always call 
one of our offices for more infor-
mation," said Shaw. 

The numbers are: (806) 247-2220 
for Friona, (505) 763-7412 for Clovis, 
and 355-2302 for Portales. 

Scotty Savage of the Curry County Bill Donham of the Parmer County 
Soil Conservation Service. 	 Soil Conservation Service. 

•••••••••••••••••••• • • • . 	• 
• Sherley-Anderson Grain  • •
• of Lariat 	• 

• 
• 
• 

for buying our barrows at the Parmer County Junior •  
Livestock Show. Your support is appreciated. 

• • 
• STEVE and LISA GERIES • 
• • 
•••••••••••i•••••••• 

THANK YOU 

s1.39 Size Bag Lay's 

POTATO CHIPS 

89' 
Van Camp No. 300 

White-Yellow 

HOMINY 
4/$1.00 

31 Oz. 6 Pk. 

COCA COLA 
$1.99 

Van Camp No. 300 

BUTTER BEANS 

1/89' 

Choice 1 lb. Box 

CRACKERS 

59' 

Kounty Kist 12 Oz. Can w/k 

CORN 
3/$1.00 

Shurfresh 14 Oz. Ct. 

COTTAGE CHEESE 

$1.09 

Larsen's No. 303 

VEG-ALL 

2/89' 

Lucky Leaf 20 Oz. Can 
(Reg. or Lite) 

CHERRY PIE FILLING 
99c 

Chicken-of-Sea 6% Oz. 
Water-Oil Pk. 

TUNA 

69' 

A.F. Plastic Gallon Jug 

MILK 
$1.89 

300dStmddis 
•. 

 

 

LEAN BONELESS STEW MEAT 
	

LEAN BONELESS CHUCK STEAK 

Lb. Y1.49 
	

Lb. '1.19 

BONELESS ROUND STEAK 
	

BEEF CUTLETS 

Lb. 81.49 
	

Lb. '1.59 
HORMEL SMOKED PORK CHOPS 

	
Lb. $1.89 

Shurfresh (Grade A Med.) 

EGGS 

69' 

Kelloggs 20 Oz. Box 

SUGAR-FROSTED FLAKES 
, 	'1.99 - 	% 

Asstd. 33/4 Oz. Box 

JELLO INST. PUDDINGS 

249' 

Texsun 46 Oz. Can 

PINK GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 

- 	99' 

Charmin 4 Roll Pkg.  

BATHROOM 
TISSUE 

lharm~n 1.09 

Kraft Ot.  

MIRACLE 
WHIP 

$1.59 
ilmf 

	• 
GARDEN FRESH PRODUCE 

Calif. Red Ripe 	 Mexico Sugarloaf 

STRAWBERRIES Each Ct. 89' PINEAPPLE 	Each 69' 
Calif. Vine Ripe 
	 Col. U.S. No. 1 10 Lb. Bag 

TOMATOES 3 Lb. $1.00 RUSSET POTATOES 	99 

FROZEN FOODS 

Owen's 12 Oz. Pkg. 

SAUSAGE/BISCUIT 
OR HAM/CHEESE 

BISCUIT 
Pkg. $1.59 

Borden's 

Half Gallon 

ICE CREAM 

'1.59 

Mrs. Paul's 
121/4 Oz. Pkg. 

FISH STICKS 

'1.59 

Capitol Foo 
900 Ave. A, Farwell - Ph. 481-3432 

Open til 9 o'clock Every Night 	We Redeem U.S.D. A. Food Stamps 

No segment of the economy has ever been 
challenged to change so fast and so completely 
as has the new agriculture. 

Never in American history have so many 
innovations been adopted in such a short time. 

When these changes have required 

capital, your Federal Land Bank 

Association has been a primary source 

of funds. We recognize the 

inevitability of change — except in the 

importance of the man and the land. 

We also believe that a free agriculture 

— based on the family farm — 

will continue to flourish in any new 
environment. 

Bill Liles, Manager 
	

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 

FEDERAL LAND BANK 

LENDER 

7ote ed4 
The Farwell Fire Department 

ambulance transported a patient 
from 903 Seventh St. to Clovis High 
Plains Hospital at 2:04 p.m. Feb. 10. 

The Clovis Dispatcher reported a 
house fire at 611 S. Florence Feb_5 
at 11:31 p.m. No one was hurt. 0 

Toward the pre-season 
purchase of a new John Deere 

"R" or "S" Series Riding Mower. 
Bounty applies through March 1 only. 

List Price 

Sale Price 

Reward Money 

$1199 $1339 $1549 $1689 $1849 

1174 1314 1524 1654 1814 

-100 -100 -100 -100 -100 

You Pay Only $1074 	$1214 	$1424 	$1554 	$1714 

R70 
8-hp, 
recoil 
start 

R72 
8-hp, 

electric 
Start 

S82 
8-hp, 

electric 
start 

S92 
11-hp, 
electric 

start 

R92 
11-hp, 

electric 
start 

a 

The soil conservation services of 
Curry County, and Parmer County, 
hosted the sixth annual Conser-
vation Tillage Workshop at the 
Farwell Community Center Feb. 3. 

Over 250 people attended the 
meeting to hear speakers and see 
the displays provided by commer-
cial represenatives. 

"I'm well pleased with the turn-
out," said Bill Donham of the 
Farmer County Soil Conservation 
Service. "There is still interest in 
the agricultural community. They 
are finding ways to conserve the soil 
and water resources and still make 
a profit out of it." 

Dick Shaw of the Curry County 

Sheree Montgomery is shown with 
the first place Sesquicentennial 
quilt block. 

Montgomery, 

Sidei win 1st 
Top Sesquicentennial quilt blocks 

wire chosen in Parmer County by a 
panel of judges. 

First place went to a team of 
Sheree Montgomery and Tina Sides. 
Second place was won by Sarah 
Dean and third place quilt block was 
entered by Mrs. Grady King. 

Each local quilter entered their 
own special characteristic of Par-
ther County. Entries were then 
judged on overall appearance, 
workmanship, design, theme, 
material and use of color. 

The first place blocks from the top 
,26 Pinhandle counties will become 
part of a queen size Sesquicenten-
nial quilt at the Panhandle-Plains 
Historical Museum on Feb. 21, 22 

..and 23. Anyone with quilting ex-
perience is eligible to participate in 
the quilting bee. 

Reservations must be made in 
advance for quilting time slots by 
calling Jo Anne Arasim at the mus-
eum at (806) 655-7191. 

Sisatig Re.,644t 

The Parmer County Sheriff's De-
partment reported three arrests: 

On Feb. 6, Ignacio Estrada, 32, 
Friona, was arrested by the Texas 
Highway Department on a charge of 
driving while intoxicated. He ap-
peared before County Judge Porter 
Roberts, pled guilty and was fined 
$250 and court costs of $104 and 
given three days in jail. He was also 
tried on a charge of theft by worth-
less check, pled guilty and was fined 
$1 and court cost of $109 and agreed 
to make restitution of $21.63. 

On Feb. 8, Emilio Castaneda Jr., 
19, Friona, was arrested by the 
Texas Highway Department on a 
charge of driving while intoxicated. 
He appeared before Roberts Feb. 
10, pled guilty and was fined $250 
and court cost of $104 and given 
three days in jail. 

On Feb. 10, Manuel Ernesto 
Miles, 27, Friona, was arrested by 
the Sheriff's Department on a 
charge of assault. He appeared 
before Roberts and pled not guilty. 
His bond was set at $1,000; his case 
is pending before county court. 

Board rejects bids 
The Texico School Board, Tues-

day opened bids to the Younger 
property. 

The board rejected all bids. The 
property will be up again for bids in 
the near future. 

The board accepted an audit bid 
from D'Aun Willoughby of Melrose. 

They transferred Chapter I funds 
to acquire library and textbooks. 

They will be hiring activity bus 
drivers at the same rate as sub-
stitute teachers. 

The board voted to buy 60 new 
desks for the high school and junior 
high. 
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Conservation Tillage workshop draws large turnout 

School Lunch Menu 
Texico 	 Farwell 

MONDAY - Nachos with 
cheese sauce, lettuce salad, 
pinto beans, cornbread, fruit 
and milk. 

TUESDAY - Sloppy Joe, but-
tered corn, celery stick, cin-
namon rolls, fruit and milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Fish sticks, 
'macaroni and cheese, cole 
slaw, jello with fruit, cookie, 
cornbread and milk. 

THURSDAY - Turkey strips, 
gravy, creamed potatoes, let-
tuce salad, fruit, hot rolls with 
honey and milk. 

FRIDAY - Beef and cheese 
tacos, Spanish rice, lettuce 
salad, cherry cobbler and milk. 

MONDAY - Burritos with 
chili and cheese, lettuce and 
tomatoes salad, buttered corn, 
cherry cobbler and milk. 

TUESDAY - Nachos with 
meat, taco salad, fruit salad, 
brownie and milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Barbeque on 
bun, French fries and catsup, 
pickles,-onions, apple crisp and 
milk. 

THURSDAY - Baked ham 
with gravy, sweet potatoes, 
green beans, hot rolls with 
butter, honey and milk. 

FRIDAY - SPRING BREAK 

CAPITOL FOODS 

e‘T 

Use your John Deere Credit Card... 
90 days same as cash * 

*No minimum month ry paymen t no Finance charge doling first 90 days 
1940 APR. 50-cent minimum monthly finance charge after 90 days 

CAL JORDAN 
IMPLEMENTS 

EAST MABRY DRIVE- 	CLOVIS 	163-5511 
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