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Delayed By Rain - - 

Area Wheat Harvest 
Begins Rolling Again 

All In The Family 

S 

well, and Kelley is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Actkin-
son of Decatur, Tex, The Youct 
Commission operates the fire-
works stand each summer to 
raise funds for the youth pro-
grams. 

of the grain was excellent this 
year, adding, "I don't know 
when I have ever seen a better 
looking wheat crop, certainly 
not in the last 20 years." 

Gary Patterson, Parmer 
County Extension agent, 
agreed, saying, "The dryland 
wheat looks above average this 
year, and the irrigated wheat is 
in excellent shape." 

Although the harvest has just 
begun and won't be over for 
another few weeks, the general 
consensus of the local elevator 
men to date is that this seems to 
be an excellent crop of wheat 
this year, in spite of the rain and 
varying hail damage. Although 
it is a little too early to deter-
mine what the overall yield 
average will be they believe the 
harvest this year will be a good 
one. 

Kelley, the sales person behind 
the counter, is helping out in the 
stand while visiting here, and no 
doubt is suggesting what fire-
works Cousin Jill should have. 
Jill is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Actkinson of Far- 

Grandmother Dodie Actkinson 
accompanies granddaughter 
Jill as she makes a selection of 
fireworks for observance of the 
Fourth of July, from the Far-
well Youth Commission's fire-
works stand. Granddaughter 

Although the hail damage was 
pretty extensive in spots, local 
elevator men feel that the 
weather hasn't hurt the yield 
production as a whole, although 
they all said that it was still too 
soon to predict what the aver-
age yield would be. 

"So far, the average yield re-
ceived has been 65-90 bushels 
per acre," said Fred Chandler 
of Sherley-Anderson-Pitman 
elevator in Farwell. "The rain 
didn't hurt us any, but it did 
bring up a few weeds. As long as 
the weather holds out and we 
can get on with harvest, I don't 
think the weeds will be a prob-
lem." 

"It hasn't picked up enough 
for us to tell about a yield aver-
age yet," said Guy Cohee at 
Worley Mills. "Things will get 
pretty busy during the next few 

days, and we can better tell 
then. I will say this, though, the 
wheat I've seen is good quality. 
It look's excellent." 

"A lot of the wheat brought to 
us is a little bleached," said 
Lonnie McFarland of Sherley-
Anderson elevator in Lariat. 
"That happens sometimes when 
you get a lot of rain, but I don't 
think the rain hurt the yield 
production. 

"It's a little too early to tell, 
but from what we've received, I 
think the yield might be 10-13 
bushels lighter than the last two 
years. This is partly due to the 
fact that we had a pretty dry 
winter, and most of the wheat is 
testing out at a lighter weight. It 
does seem to be of good quality 
though," McFarland added. 

ASCS Director Chandler also 
said that he felt that the quality 

Waiting For Acceptance - - 30 Years Of Service 

S  

Bill Boling Honored With 

Surprise Retirement Party 
Farwell City Council 

Signs Cable Contract 
At a called meeting of the 

Farwell City Council on Wed-
nesday afternoon, June 20, the 
city councilmen voted to sign a 
new franchise agreement with 
McCaw-Midwest Cable Tele-
vision. 

The new agreement was the 
result of a conference held 
earlier between Farwell City 
Councilmen Jerry Monk and 

away on a trip, and so the 
matter of the Contract's ac-
ceptance by the company will 
not be known for several more 
days. 

Farwell City Council express-
ed satisfaction with the agree-
ment which they voted to accept 
and sign, and hoped that it 
would be satisfactory and fair to 
the City and the cable company. 

Fred Chandler and the repre-
sentatives of the cable company 
at the office of Lynell Skarda, 
attorney for McCaw Cable-
vision. 

The new franchise pact will 
not be effective unless it is 
accepted by McCaw-Midwest at 
the regional office of the com-
pany in Little Rock, Ark. Mc-
Caw, head of the company, is 

Area wheat harvest is under-
way this week in earnest, after 
being temporarily haulted by 
rain, and grain trucks are 
beginning to arrive at local 
elevators with their first loads. 

Hardage and Hardage was 
first in line at Sherley-Ander-
son-Pitman elevator in Farwell 
on June 22, with a load of wheat 
testing 59 pounds and a mois-
ture content of 11.3 percent. 

Harvest was delayed again 
this year, the same as last year, 
due to the large amount of rain-
fall which the area received 
recently, just as farmers were 
gearing up for the harvest. 

Eight days and 4 to 6 inches of 
rain later, the clear skies and 
warm temperatures are allow-
ing the farmers to get on with 
the harvest. 

Although the Twin Cities 
proper received quite a beating 
from the hail that accompanied 
the first rainfall, most of the 
area farms escaped the hail 
damage. 

According to Martin Chand-
ler, executive director of Par-
mer County ASCS office, very 
few farms received hail dam-
age, but those that did were hit 
badly. "A few farms north of 
town, and out toward Lazbud-
die, received quite a bit of dam-
age," said Chandler, "but the 
majority of the county was 
spared." 

Billy Dictson, Curry County 
Extension agent, had the same 
thing to say about Curry Coun-
ty. "Curry County mostly re-
ceived a lot of rain," said Dict-
son. "We had a little hail dam-
age in the Pleasant Hill area 
and just north of Melrose, but 
compared with the rest of the 
county, we came out of it pretty 
good." 

BID Committee 

To Meet Mon. 
Border Town Days Com-

mittee will meet Monday, 
July 2, at 8 p.m. CDT at the 
Spur Restaurant, for what 
is hoped will be the final 
session before the 1984 
Twin Cities celebration. 

Plans for the annual 
event will be finalized Mon-
day night, with the sched-
ule of events set for July 28 
at Farwell City Park high-
lighting the meeting topics. 

John Getz, BTD Commit-
tee chairman, urges each 
civic and social organiza-
tion in the Twin Cities to be 
sure to have a representa-
tive on hand for this im-
portant session. "The cele-
bration is only four weeks 
away and we must com-
plete our planning," he 
said. 

"We need to hear reports 
from organizations and in-
dividuals concerning their 
participation in the BTD 
event," Getz said, "so 
please remember to attend 
the Monday night meet-
ing." 

three years to Farwell, where 
he has been for the past 27 
years. 

When Bill first came to work 
in Farwell, his office was lo-
cated in the Parmer County 
Courthouse, After 15 years in 
that location, the office was 
moved to a building on the east 
end of main street. It remained 
there for four years and then 
moved to the current offices 
located at 207 Avenue D. 

"I've seen a lot of changes in 
my years with FHA," said Bill. 
"When I first began 30 years 
ago, the maximum amount of 
money you could hand out for an 
operating loan was $7,500. That 

(Continued on Page 2} 

several friends waiting for him. 
A large cake with the inscrip-

tion "Congratulations Bill" and 
decorated with a miniature 
farmer hoeing his crop, was 
prepared for the occasion. 

As a retirement gift, his co-
workers at the FHA office pre-
sented him with a travel bag, as 
he has made plans to take an 
immediate vacation to Califor-
nia to visit his children and 
grandchildren. 

FHA office staff members are 
Jay McKay, Marcy Pena, Rob-
ert Woo, and Lestie Glover. 

Bill began working for FHA 30 
years ago in Hereford. Not long 
after he began, he was trans-
ferred to Perryton, and within 

Bill Boling, Parmer County 
supervisor of Farmer's Home 
Administration, will officially 
retire today (Friday) after 30 
years of service to the United 
States government. 

In honor of the occasion, the 
FHA office staff and the at-
torneys and staff of Aldridge, 
Harding, Aycock, and Actkin-
son hosted a surprise retire-
ment party at the law offices 
Tuesday morning. 

Attorney Hurshel Harding in-
vited Bill to the law offices 
under the pretense of handling 
some business matters. When 
Bill arrived, he was surprised to 
find his FHA co-workers, the 
entire law office staff, and 

In days of yore, Cartagena on 
the north coast of Columbia was 
a haven for pirates and buc- 
caneers preying on shipping to 
and from Central America and 
Europe. In fact, we recall that 
Errol Flynn and Tyrone Power 
sailed from this infamous port 
in several old time swashbuck- 
ling pictures. In later years it 
declined into a sleepy port city 
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	full of lawabiding burgers and 
merchants. 

For a brief time last week, the 
shades of Captain Blood must 
have chuckled at the charade 
that was being played out by 
financial ministers of several 
South American countries. 
They were much more sophisti-
cated than Blood and his ilk. 
Today, instead of boarding ship 
in a burst of cannon fire, they 
just refuse to pay debts and hi-
jack the money anyway. 

Of course, several hundred 
years ago, the victim had to be 
subdued with musket and cut-
lass. Today, the patsy comes 
running with bushel baskets full 
of greenbacks and asks to be 
relieved of same. In the old 
days, the losers put up a fight 
for their possessions. This was 
probably because they did not 

▪ have the U.S. taxpayer to reim-
burse them for their losses. 

We will admit that several 
years ago when these countries 
were running around with their 
hands out to receive infusions of 
dollars, it looked like, well al-
most like, they would be able to 
pay the big U.S. banks back, 
along with interest for a tidy 
profit. 

One thing that we can say is 
that these Third World mendi-
cants were not held to the 
standard of banking rules and 
fiscal responsibility which you, 
I, and most businesses in this 
country are expected to meet. 

Now, economic times have 
changed and these debtor 
nations cannot, and in most 
cases will not, take the difficult 
financial steps to repay their 
loans. The Head Cheeze of 
MegaBucks Bank Unlimited 
should have foreseen this possi-
bility and not have been so 
generous with the depositors' 
money. 

Most businesses that nearly 
go bankrupt, or do go bellie up, 
replace their management, but 
in this case these financiers 
seem to still be enjoying huge 
salaries, perks, and stock op-
tions. 

We have no quarrel there, but 
let's not stick the poor old Citi-
zen Taxpayer to save Mega-
Bucks Bank. If such a disaster 
does occur and the banks go 
busted, it may shake the U.S. 
financial industry, but we have 
the firm conviction that the free 
enterprise system will survive 
and that better management, 
more interested in the plight of 
home grown industry, will pro-
duce a better system in the long 
run. 

••• 

All spring we have been faith-
fully watering our front lawn, 
and thought we were doing a 
good job of keeping it green. 
After last week's more than six 
inches of rain, we discovered we 
must have just been keeping it 
alive. 

It immediately got a much 
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darker and vital looking green. 
It got lush, thick, and dense all 
over the yard. In fact we had to 
make two.cuttings a few days 
apart to mow it back to our 
normal grass height. 

Anything can grow, and grow 
abundantly out on these baldies 
if we can just get enough water 
to it. Too bad Houston doesn't 
understand where their meat, 
potatoes, and bread come from. 

O Maybe Lt. Gov. Hobby could tell 
them, but as we recall he helped 
defeat the Texas Water Im-
portation bond issue several 
years ago, and maybe he 
doesn't know either. 

Plans On Drawing Board - - 
Hospital District Continues 

Efforts For Duplex Living 
that residents can live inde-
pendently for several more 
years than is otherwise the 
case. 

The duplexes or apartments 
in a condominium setting, for 
example, will have one or two 
bedrooms, and a self-sufficient 

kitchen. The units are not con-
nected to the nursing facility. 

Interested persons may con-
tact the Farwell Hospital Dis-
trict, P.O. Box 177, Farwell, 
Tex. 79325, or call Ron Fechner, 
Convalescent Center adminis-
trator, at 481-9027. 

1985 Wheat Program 

Basic Provisions Listed 

• 411,  

You're over the hill if you can 
remember *hen cars passed 
trucks. 

••• 

You're over the hill if you can 
110 	remember when you could still 

have a nice chat even though 
you forgot the phone number. 

who has 30 years of service with 
the FHA, displays the travel 
bag given to him by the local 
FHA staff as a retirement gift. 

retirement party Tuesday 
morning. The party was hosted 
by his FHA co-workers and the 
lawyers and staff of the local 
law firm, at the law offices. Bill, 

Bill Boling, right, Parmer Coun-
ty supervisor of the Farmers 
Home Administration, accepts 
a piece of cake from Attorney 
Hurshel Harding at a surprise 

provisions include: a diversion 
to ACR equal to ten percent of 
the base is required; land di-
version payments will be $2.70 
per bushel; and eligible pro-
ducers can receive 50 percent if 
requested at signup time. 

Eligibility for the program 
benefits is limited to partici-
pants in the 1985 Wheat Pro-
gram; and maximum permit-
ted wheat acreage for ARP is 
limited to no more than 70 
percent of the farm's base, 
according to the USDA. 

United States Department of 
Agriculture recently announced 
the basic provisions of the 1985 
Wheat Program, noting that the 
Payment-in-Kind program and 
advance deficiency payments 
have not been authorized for 
1985. 

Among the provisions an-
nounced by the USDA on June 
14 include a target price of $4.38 
per bushel, and a national aver-
age loan rate of $3.30 per bushel. 

Cash land diversion payment 

Farwell Hospital District is 
continuing efforts in developing 
duplex plans for housing inde-
pendent elderly persons of Far-
well and surrounding areas in 
condominium-style living. 

Several elderly individuals 
have shown a sincere interest in 
making a new home for them-
selves in a duplex setting lo-
cated in Farwell adjacent to the 
Convalescent Center. 

The Evangelical Lutheran 
Good Samaritan Society is 
drawing up plans for the near 
future construction of the 
duplex units. 

The Hospital District will 
soon have plans for interested 
persons. 

The project encourages elder-
ly living with "beautiful sur-
roundings and personal ser-
vices provided to enhance inde-
pendence and life-style." 

Supportive services include 
help with bathing, intravenous 
injections by nurses, and the 
availability of the central dining 
room if desired. Studies show 
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Bill Boling . (Continued from Page I) 

coming vacation. On Thursday, 
the FHA office in Farwell was 
to be closed for the staff to 
attend a district meeting in 
Plainview, with the staff from 
offices in Dimmitt, Floydada, 
Littlefield, Muleshoe, Plain-
view, and Tulia all in attend-
ance, as well as staff from the 
main offices in District one and 
seven. 

Planned at this meeting was a 
surprise luncheon in Bill's 
honor. The group was to present 
Bill with a Pentax 35 millimeter 
camera as a retirement gift. 

• 

• 

Funeral Services Held 

For Garlan Edge Tues. 

Sheriffs 
Report 

Mayors At Open House 
Twin Cities mayors, John R. 
Hadley of Texico, left, and 
Walter Kaltwasser of Farwell 
were among the 144 patrons who 
attended the open house 'rues- 

• 

Texico and Farwell volunteer 
fire departments were both 
busy last week answering fire 
and ambulance calls. 

On June 21, Texico Volunteer 
Fire Department received a 
call for an ambulance to the 
Target Truck Stop on the Clovis 
Highway. The victim was trans-
ported to the Clovis hospital. 

On June 23, the ambulance 
was called to a Turner Street 
residence where it transported 
a resident to the Clovis hospital. 

Also on June 23, the fire 
trucks were called to a Texico 
business on the highway to 
extinguish a pickup fire. 

On June 20, Farwell Volun-
teer Fire Department received 
a call for an ambulance to the 
Convalescent Center where a 
resident was transported to the 
Clovis hospital. 

On June 25, the ambulance 
was called to Fourth Street 
where a resident was transport-
ed to the Friona hospital. 

Pleasant Hill Volunteer Fire 
Department reported no calls 
received. 

know that this is their post of-
fice, and we want to be able to 
run it to their satisfaction," he 
said. 

day morning at Farwell Post 
Office. Postmaster Otis McMil-
lan, right, enjoyed conducting 
guests on tours of the post office 
building. "I want the people to 

tales; 
Also, 15 grandchildren, five 

great grandchildren, and nu-
merous nieces and nephews. 

Pallbearers were Vane 
Dosher, Lewis Cooper, Bryan 
Kube, Martin Kube, Doug 
Scioli, and Buddy Adkins. 

Honorary bearers were 
Benny Haney and Junior Fore-
man. 

• 
Many Patrons Attend 

Post Office Open House 

was to cover the purchasing of 
your equipment and such for a 
year. Today, the maximum 
amount of money you can loan 
under an operating loan is 
$200,000. Quite a difference," he 
said. 

"Another big change that I've 
seen in this office is the number 
of different loans that can be 
made. When I first started, you 
could only make three types of 
loans, an operating loan, used 
mainly to help a young farmer 
get started; a farm housing 
loan, given out only to farmers 
who were purchasing a farm 
house; and a farm ownership 
loan, to help a farmer purchase 
a farm. But he could only farm 
the land he purchased with that 
loan. 

"Today, there are 23 or 24 
different types of loans. We can 
loan money on golf courses, or 
make home loans in towns 
under 10,000 population for 
example. A lot has changed. 

"Interest rates have changed 
of course. Thirty years ago an 
operating loan was made on 
about five percent interest, an 
emergency loan on three or four 
percent. Housing loans were 
given with four percent interest. 
Since then, the interest rates 
have gone as high as 16 percent 
on operating and housing loans. 
But right now they are down to 
10.25 for operating, and 11.78 
percent for home loans. It's all 
changed, all right." 

Bill says that he has no im-
mediate plans for what he 
wants to do now, but he is 
planning an enjoying his up- 

Oriental Stucco 110.45 

Masonry Cement 4.25 

Portland Cement 4.95 

Storm Windows 030.00 & Up 

Insulation - fiberglass 0.20 Per Sq. ft. 

Another act of vandalism 
occurred at Farwell Schools 
over the weekend, according to 
the report from the Parmer 
County Sheriff's Department. 

Officials at the school report-
ed that sometime over the 
weekend someone put water in 
the gas tanks of three tractor 
mowers while parked on the 
south side of the bus barn, Also, 
it was reported that items were 
scattered everywhere. Amount 
of the damage was unknown. 

In other action, Armando 
Ortiz, 19, of Bovina was arrest-
ed on June 23 by sheriff's 
officers on a charge of un-
authorized use of a motor 
vehicle. 

Ortiz appeared before Justice 
of the Peace Albert Smith on 
June 25, and his bond was set at 
$3,000. The case is pending 
Grand Jury action. 

Funeral services for Garlan 
H. Edge, 70, of Texico were con-
ducted Tuesday, June 26, from 
Steed-Todd Chapel in Clovis. 
Officiating was Rev. V. Ray 
Allen, pastor of Bethel Assem-
bly of God Church in Clovis. 

Interment was in the Texico 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Steed-Todd Funeral Home. 

Mr. Edge died Saturday, June 
23, at Clovis High Plains Hos-
pital. He was born March 31, 
1914, in Caddo Mills, Tex. He 
married Nadine Bratcher on 
May 28, 1938, in Mountainair, 
N.M. 

The couple had lived in and 
around Texico since 1951. Mr. 
Edge was the street supervisor 
for the City of Texico. He was a 
member of the Assembly of God 
Church. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Nadine, of the home in Texico; 
one son, Odell Edge of Texico; 
four daughters, Corine Mallouf 
of Muleshoe, Carolyn Harrison 
of Chico, Tex., Dorothy Rey-
nolds of Hot Springs, Ark., and 
Wilma Miller of Amarillo; one 
brother, Elbert Edge of Por- 
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Free Delivery To 
Texico & Farwell 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

rated in post office colors of red, 
white and blue. The tablecloth 
was white edged in red and blue 
stripes. Napkins were assorted 
in colors of red, white and blue, 
and an arrangement of red, 
white and blue flowers in a 
mailbox centered the table. 

Modean McMillan, wife of the 
postmaster, baked the wide 
assortment of cookies and 
breads and made the punch. 

While some guests enjoyed 
the refreshments, Postmaster 
McMillan conducted other 
guests on tours of the post office 
building, showing the recent 
changes and additions, and ex-
plaining the equipment. 1201 E. first 	Clovis 	763-4437 

Some 144 patrons signed the 
guest book at the open house 
hosted by the Farwell Post 
Office on Tuesday morning. 

Purpose of the open house 
was to acquaint the postal pat-
rons with the operations of the 
post office, and to acquaint 
postal employees with their 
patrons so that they might find 
ways to serve them better. 

Guests were registered in the 
foyer of the building by Post-
master Otis McMillan's six-
year-old granddaughter Lana 
who is visiting from Amarillo, 
and serving refreshments of 
punch and cookies was his 
daughter Melinda. 

The serving table was deco- 

Around The 	11 
Twin Cities 

In a non-leap year, the 
middle day of the year is 
July 2. 

• 

Tribune Sets Early Deadline 

***MOM ,* arnlint 
FREEDOMS BANNER 

Both city offices, both banks, 
as well as Summit Savings 
office, will be closed on Wed-
nesday. 4 

4 

Tuesday afternoon ready for the 
printers, instead of on Wednes-
day. 

Other offices planning to ob-
serve the Fourth of July holiday 
are Parmer County ASCS of-
fice, Farmers Home Adminis-
tration office, and both Texico 
and Farwell post offices. 

The State Line Tribune will 
have an early deadline next 
week.its deadline date for news 
stories and pictures will be 
moved up one day, to Monday at 
5 p.m., so that the staff may 
enjoy the July 4th holiday. 

The paper will be published as 
usual by noon on Thursday, but 
the issue will be made up on 

Parmer County Courthouse 
will also be closed for the holi-
day, with the exception of the 
sheriff's office which will re-
main open as usual. 

se> se) se> se> se> se> 

Bill 

Says 

SELL! 
. . . o'er the land of the free! 

Our flag symbolizes those ideals that 

the Dec laration of Independence set forth 

on that very first Fourth of July. 

Let us pledge ourselves anew to the 

cause of Liberty as we celebrate 

Independence Day 19134. 

197618 760 24 ft head V-8, 
Hydrostat 	$17,500. 

1976 III 915 24 ft. head, clean 
$16,500. 

1975 111 915 201(, head 
$13,500. 

ID 6600, 20 ft. head 

$11,000 • 

Waiver of Finance until Jan. 1,1965 

Wooley International,Inc 
East Highway 70-84, Muleshoe 

E.N.M.R. Telephone Cooperative 
7111 N. Prince - Clovis - Ph. 389-5100 

T;F.1 
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GARLAN EDGE 

MONDAY, JULY 2 
Farwell Convalescent Center 

Auxiliary quarterly meeting, 4 
p.m., at the Center. 

..• 

Farwell Country Club Ladies 
Association, 7 p.m., at the coun- 
try club. 

stip 

Border Town Days Commit-
tee, 8 p.m. CDT, Spur Restau-
rant. 



Farwell Delegate 
Mark Cole, Farwell School's 
delegate to Boys State, recently 
returned from the mythical 51st 
state, at the University of Texas 
in Austin, where he learned first 
hand about the functions of the 
government on state, county, 
and city levels. Mark was elect- 

ed to the state campaign com-
mittee for his party, the Fed-
eralist, which made a clean 
sweep of the major state offices 
in the general election. Mark is 
the son of Marcia Cole of Far-
well, and will be a senior at 
Farwell High next school year. 

Classified Ads Get Results 

• 

• 

1984 Texas Boys State 
Over 1,000 boys participated in 
the 1984 Texas American Legion 
Boys State at the University of 
Texas in Austin, setting a new 
record. The 51st mythical state 
consisted of 20 cities with ap-
proximately 50 citizens each. 
The citizens elect all govern-
ment officials in the two politi-
cal parties, Nationalist and 
Federalist. Mark Cole was the 

Boys State delegate from Far-
well High School. He was a resi-
dent of Sherwood City and a 
member of the Federalist 
Party. Mark described the trip 
as "a memorable experience" 
where he made many new 
friends and learned much about 
state government and the state 
court system. 

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

`When Understanding Is Needed Most' 
Prince & Manana-Clovis 

Ph. 763-5541 

GREAT 
PERFORMERS 

Phillips 66 Regtear 
and 

Unleaded Gasolines 

Clean Out The Warehouse 

TIRE SALE! 
All Current & Discontinued Stock 

AT BIG SAVINGS 
For Truck - Pick Up - Cars 

All New Tires With Full Warrenty 

Sale Ends June 30 

Helton Oil, Inc. 
Serving The Texico—Farwell Area 

Ph. 481-3222 

THERE'S ONE NEAR YOU ® 

T V SPECIAL 
' 

(6' 	
a  .1  • 

. 	• 

ZEE TOWEL8 

499:10 

I'  

• 

likeinSoft 
• 11.1,•00.1 111.NA 

*June is Dairy Month  
BORDEN'S HOMO 

* MILK 

11-:1 $249  fa. 
_ 

IMP'S ASSTD. FLAVORS 

S
CREAM 

CTN 

NOM LIMIT WATER OR OIL  

%IL CHUNK TUNA 

69' 

OPEN JULY 4TH g 
PRICES EFFECTIVE 

JUNE 28.30, 1984 
SHOP ALLSUP'S FOR ALL YOUR PICNIC 
SUPPLIES- ICE• MILK• GROCERIES-
PRODUCE-SNACKS- HOT COOKED FOODS-
LUNCH MEATS WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 

COOKED FOOD SPECIAL 

Chili Dogs 	49cea 

Ham & Cheese 
99' 

THERE'S ALWAYS SOMETHING GOOD 
COOKING FOR YOU AT ALLSUP'S 

PEPSI 

Pepsi Light 

Diet Pepsi 

Mountain Dew 

CHARCOAL 
BRIQUETS 

11
BA

9  
10 II 

B 

SHURFRESH 11111M0011 CHEDDAR 

CHEESE 
99 
16 OZ. PKO. 

w 

a 
a 

z 
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* ASSTD. COLORS BATHROOM TISSUE 
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B00011 

HORMEL SLACK LABEL 

BACON 1 45 
1 LB, 
PKB. 

ICE 'N SOFT 

119CROLL PM) 

EXIING 
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VANILLA 
ICE CREAM 

16 Oz. 6 Pk. 

PEPSI 
t2 09 

\IP  
* 

* 
* 

SHURFRESH SLICED IND. WRAPPED AMERICAN* 

CHEESE 
$1 29 

12 02 PRO  
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Texas Boys State - - 

`Memorable Experience' Says Delegate 

State Line Tribune, Friday, June 29, 1984 - Page 3 

Texas DPS Officer Urges 

Safe Driving For Holiday 

by Mark Cole 
Attending Texas Boys State 

was a unique experience for me. 
I learned a great deal about our 
state government and our state 
court system. The session was 
at the University of Texas in 
Austin, June 2-8. 

Each participant in the Boys 
State program is placed in a 
city, county, and one of four dis-
tricts which make up the mythi-
cal 51st state of the United 
States. The participants then 
proceed to organize and run the 
state government by electing 
officials and passing bills. 

Citizens elect all government 
officials from one of two politi-
cal parties, either Nationalist or 
Federalist. 

In the 1984 Texas Boys State 
0 (which was the largest ever) 

there were 20 cities with ap-
proximately 50 members each. 
This added up to just over 1,000 
high school seniors who took 
part in this year's program. 

Upon arrival I found I had 
been placed in Sherwood City 
(which was named after a 
former Texas Department 

. . 

Commander) and was a mem-
ber of the Federalist Party. 

During the first day we elect-
ed city officials and organized 
city governments. 

The next task was to elect 
delegates to our state conven-
tion, so our parties could hold 
orderly meetings. During party 
meetings the voting delegates 
are needed to vote on certain 
issues, since it is nearly impos-
sible to take a hand count when 
500 people are together. 

Beginning on Tuesday eve-
ning, the two parties split apart 
and began a series of meetings 
as separate political parties. 
During these meetings we 
developed our party platform, 
devised a campaign strategy, 
and held primary elections. 

After many debates and 
speeches, the Federalist party 
platform was complete. All 
Federalist candidates were to 
stand by our platform which in-
cluded: 1) The raising of the 
legal drinking age to 21, and 
strengthening of DWI laws. 2) 
Tougher enforcement of illegal 
drug laws and full support of the  

anti-drug war. 3) Increased 
border security and stronger 
penalties against illegal aliens 
and employers who hire illegal 
aliens. 4) Strong opposition to 
any limitation of extracurri-
cular activities in high school. 

As a member of the Feder-
alist Party I was elected to the 
state campaign committee, and 
received the Federalist Party 
nomination for county attorney. 

On Wednesday evening, the 
two parties met together once 
again to hear speeches for all 
state offices. Later that evening 
votes were cast for all offices in 
the general election. 

Early the next morning re-
sults were announced and it was 
revealed that there had been a 
Federalist party sweep of the 
major state offices (governor, 
It. governor, and attorney 
general). Unfortunately, in my 
bid for the office of county at-
torney, I was defeated by the 
Nationalist candidate by a mar-
gin of four votes. 

The week wrapped up with all 
elected officials taking their 
oath of office and getting ac- 

quainted with the offices they 
would be holding. 

On Friday, all citizens were 
treated with a visit to the Capi-
tol Building. I chose to take the 
tour of the Attorney General's 
Office, where we met and spoke 
with Texas Attorney General, 
Jim Mattox. 

During the recreation pro-
gram at Boys State, I partici-
pated in basketball, and volley-
ball (in which Sherwood City 
proceeded to go undefeated and 
win the state championship), 
and took the official Boys State 
Bar Exam which qualified me 
to practice as a Boys State 
Lawyer. 

To add to the excitement of 
the week, we also heard speech-
es by Supreme Court Chief 
Justice Jack Polk, and Gover-
nor Mark White. 

This trip was really a memor-
able experience for me. I made 
many new friends whom I will 
always remember, and learned 
many things I never would have 
known had I not had the oppor-
tunity to attend. 

"Fifty percent of all traffic 
deaths are alcohol related," 
said Major V.J. Cawthon, Re-
gional Commander of the Texas 
Department of Public Safety. 

During the holidays, this per-
centage is considerably higher 
because some drivers think the 
best way to celebrate a holiday 
is by drinking and driving, 
whether on vacation or at the 
area lake. 

This 4th of July Holiday, lives  

will be lost and people will be 
injured in traffic accidents. 

"The best way to have a safe 
accident-free holiday this 4th of 
July is by not drinking and 
driving, observing all traffic 
laws, and not trying to pack a 
week's vacation into a two-day 
holiday," Major Cawthon said. 

"Be especially watchful for 
the other driver and remember 
that your safety and the safety 
of your family depends on you." 

New Basic Cable Channels 

MN1  
4fteuezza 

le
ode/my:vita/et 
twoek 

CNN (Cable News Network] All 
news-24 hours a day. CNN keeps 
you up-to-date on national and 
international affairs, business, 
sports, medicine and the current 
weather picture. Plus there are 
daily feature stories. 

111.11114 	
M c  Caw 

total  Cabltuision 

--.1600 Main - Clovis - Ph. 763-4411 



Farwell 1955 Graduates 

Eastern New Mexico University 
Corral Playhouse presents 

V CHECK 
OUR USED 

UNITS! 
'80 - 34 ft. Southwind 

'79 - 28 ft. Terry 

'81 - 24 ft. Nomad 

'78 - 19 ft. Prowler 

'79 - 33 ft. Coachman 

'81 - 31 ft. Taurus 

'82 - 16 ft. Shasta 

BISON R.V. 

CENTER 
762-9506 

1200 E. 1st - 	- Clovis 
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1984 Olympic Torch Relay Menus ARA Olympic Torch Relay Recipes 
DAY ONE 	DAY FOUR 

SPINACH SOUFFLE POACHED SALMON STEAK 
[ with avocado tarragon sauce] 

cold with the avocado tarragon 
sauce. BREAKFAST 

Grapefruit • Bartlett Pears 

Choice Of Cold Cereal - Hot Oatmeal 

Scrambled Eggs - Western Omelet 
Grilled Sirloin Tip Steak 

Hash Brown Potatoes 
Assorted Doughnuts • Croissants 

• BREAKFAST 
Cantaloupe Wedge Grapefruit Half 

Apple Sauce 

Choice Of Cold Cereal - Hot Oatmeal 

Scrambled Eggs - Waffles 

Filet MignOn/Garni - 

Tri•Tater Potatoes 

Blueberry Muffins Assorted Danish 
LUNCH 

Sliced Roast Round of Beef with 

Horseradish Sauce 

Poached Halibut Steak With 

Lemon Butter 

Baked Potato With Sour Cream And 

Chives • Rice Pilaf 

Green Garden Peas With 

Sliced Mushrooms 

Carrot Cake With 
Butter Cream Icing 

Cold Plate: Fresh Fruit, Berries, 
Cottage Cheese 

Sandwich Bar 

• 
LUNCH 

Baked Florida Red Snapper 

Chinese Beef With Green Peppers 

Baked Macaroni With Cheese Sauce 

Mixed Japanese Vegetables - 

Pecan Pie 

The Sandwich Bar 
Cold Plate: Asparagus Tips 

Tomato With Back Fin Crab Meat 

DINNER 
Wisconsin Cheddar Cheese Soup 

Hearts of Romaine Lettuce Salad 
Roasted Tom Turkey With 

Pan Gravy 

New Orleans Style Shrimp Creole 

Steamed Rice • Turkey Stuffing 
Broccoli Spears.- Harvard Beets 

Hot Apple Pie 

Mandarin Orange Cake 

Sandwich Bar 

6 salmon filets 
Sauce 
1 cup sour cream 
2 tsp. tarragon vinegar 
2 tsp. green onion, chopped 
1 Tbs. parsley, snipped 
1/4  tsp. seasoned salt 
1 California avocado, peeled 

Coaunrdt Bouillon 
2 quarts water 
12 cup cider vinegar 
1 tsp. salt 
6 oz. carrots, sliced 
8 oz. onion, diced 
12  bay leaf 
1/8 tsp. thyme 
8 peppercorns 
8 parsley stalks 

Prepare the sauce; combine 
sour cream, vinegar, onion, 
parsley and salt. Mash the 
avocado and add to the sour 
cream mixture just before serv- 
ing. 

Poach the salmon filets in the 
court bouillon and serve hot or 

3 Tbs. butter or margarine 
1/4  cup flour 
11/4  cups milk 
3 eggs, slightly beaten 
1 package (10 ounces) frozen 

chopped spinach, thawed and 
well-drained 

3 Tbs. grated onion 
ti2  teaspoon salt 
1/8 teaspoon pepper 
1/8 teaspoon ground nutmeg 

Preheat oven to 350°F. Gen-
erously grease a shallow 1-
quart casserole. In small sauce-
pan, melt butter. Blend in flour. 
Gradually add milk. Cook over 
medium heat, stirring frequent-
ly, until thickened. 

In large mixing bowl, com-
bine remaining ingredients and 
white sauce; mix well. Pour 
into prepared casserole. Set 
casserole in pan of hot water. 
Bake 45 minutes or until slightly 
puffed and knife inserted near 
center comes out clean. Makes 4 
servings. 

• 

DINNER 
German Lentil Soup - Wedge Of 

Iceberg Lettuce 
Baked Haddock Steak - Roast Lion 

Of Pork 
Rice Pilaf - Gnocchi In 

Tomato Sauce 

Broccoli Florets - Mexican 

Style Corn 
Blueberry Pie - Fresh Strawberries 

The Sandwich Bar 

DAY FIVE 

DAY TWO 

Gene Hardage, Windell Pike, 
H.R. Billingsley, Dean Walls, 
Phillip Crume, Robbie Foster, 
Yselta Brown Kittrell, Glenn 
Lee, Elaine Martin, Jerry 
Poteet, Lavon Jones, Leon Box, 
Lavoyda Billington, Ed Rol-
land, and Billy Watts. 

Barbara Garner, Gloria Dial, 
reporter; Dick Felts, Mona Mc-
Dorman, Burl Anderson, 
Loretta Stancell, James Rob-
erts, Joyce Maxwell, Joe Rob-
erts, Doris Threet, Barbara 
Metcalf, Deon Branscum, 
Agnes Meissner, Jesse Meeks, 

Left to right, top to bottom: 
Jack Williams, superintendent; 
W.M. Roberts, sponsor; Mrs. 
H.K.Milford, sponsor; H.K. Mil-
ford, sponsor; Doyle Ford, 
president; Don Geries, vice-
president; Carolyn Huffaker, 
secretary; Don Pool, treasurer; 

Hospital 

Notes 

BREAKFAST 
Honeydew Melon Giant Sweet 

Strawberries 
Choice Of Cold Cereal - Hot Cream 

Of Wheat 

Scrambled Eggs - Buttermilk 

Pancakes 
Bacon Strips - Suger Cured 

Ham Steak 

Cottage Fried Potatoes 
Hot Baked Apple - Assorted Danish 

Bran Muffins 

8th Grade Graduation 

Pictures Ready July 9 
Farwell Teachers Attend 

BREAKFAST 
Spanish Melon -California Prunes 

Choice Of Cold Cereal - Cream 
Of Wheat 

Scrambled Eggs - French Toast 
With Maple Syrup 

Grilled Canadian Bacon Pork 

Link Sausage 
Home Fried Potatoes 

Assorted Danish • Croissants 

LUNCH 
Broiled Rib Eye Steak 

Baked Lobster Tail 
Noodles Au Gratin Italian 

Green Beans 

Chocolate Mousse 
The Sandwich Bar 

Cold Plate: Pasta, Tuna Salad 
And Peas 

tional selections may be made 
at this time. 

Those students unable to be at 
the high school on July 9, may 
pick up their pictures later at 
the high school office, or at the 
beginning of the school term in 
the fall. 

Farwell 8th grade graduation 
pictures will be available Mon-
day, July 9, at the high school. 

The photographer will be at 
the high school from 11 a.m. 
until 2 p.m., and pictures which 
have been ordered and paid for 
may be picked up, and addi- 

Society's State Meeting 

Russ Jones Receives BS Degree 

Lavon Mills of Farwell is still 
confined in St. Anthony's Hospi-
tal in Amarillo undergoing 
treatment for a broken hip. She 
is reported to be doing better. 

E.R. Coffman of Farwell was 
admitted to the Friona hospital 
Monday evening. His condition 
is critical. 

• • • 

SMALLWOOD INSURANCE 

AGENCY 

Successors to 
High Plains Insurance 

AUTO • HOME • LIABILITY 

Up to 30% deviation on Home Insurance 
policies. Call us to see if you qualify to save. 

Ph. 806/272-4531 	Muleshoe, Ti. 

WTSU—Russell Jones of Can-
yon has been awarded a Bache-
lor of Science degree at West 
Texas State University. 

Jones was among 876 candi-
dates for graduation during 
spring commencement cere-
monies. The number of candi-
dates also included 144 students 
earning master's degrees. 

Jones, who earned the BS de-
gree in agricultural business 
and economics, was one of 34 
students earning degrees from 
the School of Agriculture. 

Russ and his wife Benetta 
„(esicle‘  in Canyon where he is 

The \ 	—4  

LUNCH 

Sauteed Medallions Of Veal - Baked 
Scrod With Lemon Wedge 

Fettucini Alfredo • Zucchini 

Casserole 
Chocolate Eclair 

The Sandwich Bar 
Cold Plate: Deli Selection Of Roast 

Beef, Turkey 
Smoked Ham, Swiss Cheese With 

Potato Salad, Relishes, And Pickles 

Farwell school teachers, 
Lynn Roberts and Judy How-
ard, were among 1200 women 
educators from throughout 
Texas who met in Amarillo 
June 14-17 for the 55th annual 
state convention of Delta Kappa 
Gamma Society International. 

The two local women are 
members of Iota Eta chapter of 
Delta Kappa Gamma. Mary 
Bavousett, Tommie Mercer, 
Faye Reeves, and Wana 
Brewer, all of Friona also at- 

tended. 
In addition to workshops and 

business sessions, attendants 
participated in festive and cere-
monial occasions such as the 
Birthday Luncheon, Memorial 
Service, and the Founder's Day 
Dinner. The group also attended 
the barbecue and musical pro-
duction of "Texas" in Palo Duro 
Canyon. 

Special recognition was given 
to scholarship recipients from 
Delta Kappa Gamma. 

DINNER 
Cream Of Broccoli Soup Mixed 

Green Salad 
Beef Goulash - Baked Boneless 

Idaho Brook Trout 

Rissole Potatoes - Baked Egg 
Noodles 

Spinach Souffle . Sliced Carrots With 
Butter Sauce 

Boston Cream Pie - Chocolate 
Truffle 

The Sandwich Bar 

County Judge Porter Roberts 
remains hospitalized in St. An-
thony's in Amarillo for medical 
treatment. His co-workers re-
port that he is showing more 
improvement each day. Calls 
are still not allowed but visitors, 
cards and letters are welcomed. 
He is in room 317. More Menus . . . 

DINNER 
New England Clam Chowder 

Ribb Lettuce • Hearts Of Palm And 
Marinated Artichokes 
Baked Salmon Steak 

Sliced Roast Leg Of Veal 
Long Grain Rice 

Stuffed Pasta Shells With 

Tomato Sauce 

Asparagus Spears • 
Crookneck Squash 

Red Velvet Walnut And Apple Pie 
The Sandwich Bar 

SANDWICH BAR MENU 

DAY SIX 
Cantaloupe Melon 

Choice Of Cold Cereal - 
Hot Wheatena 

Scrambled Eggs • Waffles 
Strip Steak • Potato Pancakes 

Croissants • Coffee Cake 

Made-To-Order Sandwiches 
Available At All Times 

DAY THREE 
One of the first lamps was 
a wick dipped in grease. The 
holder was made of stone. 

employed at the ASCS office 
there. He is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe W. Jones of Farwell. 

SLICED LONDON BROIL 
[with sauce Chasseur] 

8 oz. flank or skirt steak 
15 oz. oil 
81,2 oz. vinegar 
1/4  tsp. salt 
1/41 tsp. PePPer 
1 bay leaf 
ti tsp. garlic powder 

Score steak diagonally about 
1/8" deep on each side. Com-
bine ingredients. Marinate 
steaks in marinade overnight in 
refrigerator. Shake off excess 
marinade. 

Place steaks on baking sheets 
in a single layer. Bake 500°F. 
for 12 minutes until meat is 
medium rare. DO NOT OVER-
COOK. Cook throughout meal 
period as necessary. Slice by 
hand close to order. 
Sauce Chasseur 
4 oz. butter 
1 lb. mushrooms, fresh chopped 
2 oz. green onion, chopped 1,"  

1 oz. flour 
112 Tbs. tomato puree 
2 cups white wine 
1 quart beef consomme, hot 
4 oz. butter 
3 Tbs. parsley, chopped 
1 Tbs. tarragon, dried 
salt as needed 

Melt butter in heavy sauce-
pan. Add mushrooms. When 
mushrooms are almost done, 
add onion. Cook until done. 
Remove mushrooms and onions 
from pan, leaving drippings in 
pan. Add flour to drippings in 
pan. Cook, stirring often, until 
golden brown. 

Add tomato puree, consomme 
and wine. Stir well. Cook until 12 
of volume has evaporated. Re-
turn mushrooms and onions to 
sauce. Add butter, parsley, and 
tarragon. Simmer 5 minutes to 
blend flavors. Taste for salt. 
Add if needed. 

• TELL OUR ADVERTISERS1  
YOU SAW IT 

IN THE TRIBUNE!  

Corned Beef - Roast Beef 
Smoked Turkey Breast 

Braunschweiger Smoked Ham 
Genoa Salami 

Swiss And American Cheese 
Peanut Butter And Jam 

BREAKFAST 
Fresh Fruit Compote - Kadota Figs 
Choice Of Cold Cereal Hot Oatmeal 

Scrambled Eggs 
Chicken A La King In Pastry Shell 

Bacon Strips 
Grilled Polish Kielbasa 
Cottage Fried Potatoes 

Corn Muffins - Assorted Danish BREAKFAST 
Grapefruit Half • Fresh Fruit 

Compote 
Choice Of Cold Cereal - Hot Grits 

Scrambled Eggs - Spanish Omelet 

Grilled Beef Rib Eye Steak - 
Potatoes Denver Style 

Assorted Doughnuts • Golden Pound 

Cake 

LUNCH 
Baked Flounder With Creole Sauce 

Pot Roast With Brown Gravy 
Noodles With Parsley And Butter 
Medley of Cauliflower, Broccoli, 

And Carrots 
Orange And Pineapple Sponge Cake 

The Sandwich Bar 
Cold Plate: Curried Chicken, Salad 

With Sliced Marinated Cucumber 

LUNCH 
Chicken Kiev 

Broiled Double Lamb Chops 
Vegetable Lasagna 

Carrots In Butter Sauce 
Chocolate Fudge Cake 

The Sandwich Bar 
Cold Plate; Tomato Stuffed With 
Shrimp Salad, Served With Hard 

Boiled Egg, Crisp Vegetable Sticks 
And Cottage Cheese 

Salads 

Turkey • Shrimp Tuna 

Assorted Breads 

LUNCH 
Boneless Breast Of Chicken 

Sliced Leg of Lamb With Mint Jelly 
Rice Pilaf Whole String Beans 

Hot Apple Crisp 

The Sandwich Bar 
Cold Plate: Chilled Jumbo Shrimp 

Creamy Cole Slaw And 
Cocktail Sauce 

French Bread Light Rye Bread 
Pumpernickel - Whole Wheat 
Sliced White Bread - Bagels 

Hard Rolls • Assorted Dinner Rolls 

Bread Sticks • Rye Crisp 
Melba - Toast 

DINNER 
Minestrone • Crunchy Salad 

Of Carrot 
Baked Smoked Ham Steak 

Turkey, Mushrooms And Pasta In 

Cream Sauce 
Saffron Rice 

Linguine With White Clam Sauce 
Baked Cauliflower, Au Gratin 

Cut Green Beans With Mushrooms 
Chocolate Chambord Fresh Berries 

And Cream 

Self-Service Dining Car Menu 
Available 24 Hours A Day 

DINNER 
Chicken Noodle Soup 

Sliced Beefsteak Tomato And 
Cucumber, Tarragon 

Sliced London Broil With 
Sauce Chasseur 

Rock Cornish Game Hen With 
Bing Cherries 

Baked Potato With Sour Cream 
And Chives 

Fettucini Prima Vera 
Mixed Japanese Vegetables- 

Candied Yams 

Amaretto Cheesecake Cherry Pie 
The Sandwich Bar 

Assorted Hot And Cold Beverages 
And Fruit Juices 

Assorted Fresh Fruits - Yogurt 

Baked Goods 
Assorted Cheeses-Assorted Snacks 

DINNER 
Chicken Gumbo - Spinach Salad 

Sirloin Strip Steak 
Baked Swordfish Steak With 

Caper Sauce 
Spanish Rice • Macaroni With 

Mushroom Cream Sauce 
Peas And Pearl Onions - 

Steamed Cabbage 
New York Cheesecake - Italian 

Rum Cake 
The Sandwich Bar 

News? Let Us Know About It! Call 481-3681 
DAY SEVEN 

BREAKFAST 
Blueberries And Cream - 

• 

fork 

Infants and 
Maternit 

Wear 
1312 Main 763.7145 

CLOVIS 

SHOPPING 
DIRECTORY 

Rd.  3 100 La Fonda i iWELL 
BODY SHOP 

Clovis, N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 For Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

2:$ 
PROMPT DEVELOPING 

SERVICE — 

ALL. SIZES FILM — - 

LARGE SELECTION 
PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

I 	0.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

617 Main 

HUDSON UPHOLSTERY 
Custom Upholstery, Slip Covers, Bedspreads 

And Decorator Specialty Items 

Friday & Saturday Nights 
8:00 pm 

Tickets: S4 General Admission S3 Senior Citizen S2 Pre-College S1 ENMU Student with ID 

Fine Arts Box Office opens Monday. June 25 	 Summer Hours: 12:00pm - 4 00pm M-F 

(505) 562-2710 	 Seating is Limited to 125 per performance. 

1325 S. Prince St. 	 Ph. 505/763-4142 
Clovis, New Mexico 

—•0 



New Methodist Family 

ENMU Play WEEKEND SPECIALS 
Thursday - Friday - Saturday 

	

Summer Shoes 	1/3 OFF 

Boys SS Knit Shirts 15% Off 
Mens SS Knit Shirts 15% OFF 
Wrangler Stretch Boot Jeans 

	

911  Reg. 	20% OFF 

Girls Spring & Summer 

Hedy Dresses 	15% OFF 
One Rack 

Mix 'N Match 	20% OFF 

fis
/

ff 	a t 
v011 DIFIVIAINT SIM 

OF CLOVIS, INC. 
520 MAIN 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 88101 

• C.111, 	 ginflfantelleiRreln. 	 _ . 	. 
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Methodists Welcome 

New Pastor, Family 

Laz. Young Homemakers Work For Community 

They have door prizes, secret 
pals, and family get-togethers. 

A spokesperson for the Laz-
buddie Young Homemakers 
said, "We really want to en-
courage membership in this 
club. Many area Young Home-
maker clubs have folded from 
lack of interest. The Lazbuddie 
organization is a vital contrib-
utor to the strength of this 
community. It will be tragic for 
this area if our club is not kept 
strong with active members." 

She also stated, "This is the 
club for anyone who is interest-
ed in a fulfilling and worthwhile 
service to and participation in 
the community, which in turn, 
benefits her own family. It is 
also the place to build life-
long friendships and have a lot 
of fun." 

Current members of the Laz-
buddie Young Homemakers in-
clude Marleen Bennett, Janice 

"To develop skills and gain 
information on new and im- 
proved methods of home-
making; to develop a deeper 
understanding of the home and 
its influence upon the commu-
nity; to plan and carry out 
activities designed to improve 
our home and community life; 
to provide wholesome, social, 
and recreational activities; to 
become better acquainted with 
the products and information of 
current consumer trends; 

"To plan and carry out a 
program for recognizing and 
honoring members and others 
for outstanding achievement; to 
support the Future Home-
makers of America and other 
groups working for the im-
provement of homemaking; to 
maintain the spiritual values of 
the home; to encourage democ-
racy in home and community 
life.'' 

Bradshaw, Vickie Burch, Cindy 
Cargile, Lana Copp, Ellen Gall-
man, Joann McDonald, Debbie 
Magby, Reta Mimms, Marca 
Morris, Debra Redwine, Mandi 
Seaton, Debbie Smith, Janette 
Thorn, Debbie Weir, and ad-
visor, Cassandra Cargile. 

The creed of the Texas Young 
Homemaker organization is: 
"We, the Young Homemakers 
of Texas, seek to strengthen the 
bonds of the family with knowl-
edge, integrity, love, under-
standing, and faith in God. In 
order that our homes may be 
established in the firm founda-
tion of our community, nation, 
and world. Upholding the right 
of each individual to dream, to 
work, and to assume the privi-
lege and responsibilities of the 
democratic way of life." 

The assigned purpose of the 
Texas Young Homemaker or-
ganization follows: 

Rev. and Mrs. Steve Stephens 
and 11-month-old Hanna Beth 
are busy getting settled into 
their new home and commu-
nity, as Steve is the new pastor 
of Hamlin Memorial United 

Home Ec Advisory Committee Meets Methodist Church in Farwell. 
Having been here only a month, 
Steve and Leesa say they al-
ready love it here, and are look-
ing forward to meeting every-
one and becoming friends. 

Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church in Farwell 
recently welcomed a new pastor 
and family into their midst. 
Steve, Leesa, and Hanna Beth 
Stephens arrived here from the 
First United Methodist Church 
in Grants, N.M., where Steve 
had been pastor for the past two 

a  years. 
Actually, Steve's name is 

Harrell E. Stephens, Jr., but he 
really prefers to be called 
Steve. Leesa is a native West 
Texan and a former Parmer 
County resident, having grown 
up in Friona. Her parents are 
Joe and Tommie Mercer of 
Friona. 

Steve was born in Knox City, 
Tex., but attended schools in 

s  Abilene, graduating from 
Cooper High School there in 
1972. Steve attended McMurry 
College in Abilene where he 
graduated in 1978. 

In the fall of 1978 he entered 
the Perkins School of Theology 
at Southern Methodist Univer-
sity in Dallas, where he partici-
pated in Student Council and 
sang with the Seminary Sing- 

▪ ers. Steve also enjoyed writing 
articles for a couple of campus 
newspapers, one of which he 
was editor. 

Steve fulfilled his internship 
at the First United Methodist 
Church in Midland where he 
met and married Leesa. After 
completing seminary, he joined 
the New Mexico Annual Con-
ference, accepting his first ap-
pointment in Grants in 1982. 

▪ Steve and Leesa were very 
active in both community and 
church activities while in 
Grants. Steve participated 
actively in the United Way and 
the American Cancer Society, 
as well as serving as coordina-
tor for the Youth and Camp or- 

dents (81 students), 83-84. 
Course schedule for 84-85, 

Budget of 83-84, and projections 
for 84-85. 

The purpose of the Advisory 
Committee is to provide a link 
between the community and 
school for the purpose of main-
taining and improving voca-
tional educational programs to 
equip students with skills need-
ed to become useful in society. 

Some of the responsibilities 
include interpreting the inter-
ests of the community to the 
teacher, assisting in interpret-
ing the program to the commu-
nity, assisting in the promotion 
of youth and adult homemaking 
organizations and activities, 
and evaluation of existing and 
new programs. 

responsibilities of the members. 
Vocational home economics 

courses in Texas and those 
offered at Farwell the past 
three years. 

The Conceptual Framework 
and competency objectives for 
courses set up by Home Ec. Div. 
of TEA. 

Replacement of "Home Pro-
jects" with "Encounter" per-
sonal improvement and involve-
ment experiences. 

General philosophy and focus 
of courses the past three years. 

Special projects of the pro-
gram--Parliamentary Proce-
dure for all students, 81-82; 
Decoration of Home Ec kitchen 
by HE II students, 82-83; 
Human Reproduction Unit for 
Biology, Health, and HE I stu- 

DeAnn Curtis To Tour 

Europe With U. S. Band 

ganization in the Albuquerque 
District. 

Leesa, who graduated from 
West Texas State University in 
1980 with a degree in education, 
accepted a teaching position in 
Grants. For the past four years, 
Leesa has taught grades four, 
six, and seven. She enjoys 
teaching and hopes to find a 
position in the area soon. 

Steve and Leesa are both 
active persons who enjoy sever-
al sports and hobbies. When not 
caring for Hanna Beth, Leesa 
enjoys snow skiing, horseback 
riding, playing the piano, and 
sewing, although she says she 
doesn't get to sew as much as 
she likes to. 

Steve enjoys all spectator 
sports, and participates in golf, 
snow skiing, and water skiing. 
He also likes to read, fish, talk, 
and drink coffee. "Most people 
tell me I'm best at talking and 
drinking coffee," says Steve. 

Hanna Beth is not without her 
hobbies and activities, her fa-
vorite of which is to pull 
Daddy's beard. Hanna enjoys 
eating, sleeping, and jabbering, 
and right now her main goals in 
life are to grow some hair and to 
catch the cat "Kizzie" and the 
dog Tootsie." Hanna Beth will 
be one year old on August 1. 

Steve and Leesa chose the 
name Hanna because in Hebrew 
it means peace and grace. They 
both also agree that although 
Steve's occupation is pastor, 
Hanna is not a P.K. (preacher's 
kid), she is a T.O. (theologian's 
offspring). 

Steve and Leesa both say that 
they enjoy living in West Texas 
and really like living in Farwell. 
They are looking forward to 
meeting all of the area residents 
and becoming friends. 

Randy Cains Parents Of Girl 

a 
`Coming Out' Shower 

Honors Curt Christian 

DeAnn Curtis, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. James Curtis of 
Farwell, was one of several stu-
dents at Farwell High School 
who received the All-American 
Hall of Fame Band Award this 
year. Along with the award 
came an invitation to tour Eu-
rope with the United States Col-
legiate Wind Band. 

The Collegiate Wind Band is 
directed by Al Wright of Purdue 
University, who organizes the 
band from among the students 
across the United States who 
receive this award. About 80-100 
students will perform in the 
band. DeAnn is the only Farwell 
student planning to take the 
tour. 

The Advisory Committee for 
Vocational Home Economics at 
Farwell High School met on 
June 5, in the home economics 
building. Members Eva Ancira, 
Ruth Anne Bennett, and Maxine 
Williams met with Martha 
White, home economics teach-
er. Members Eva Dean Ste-
phens and Lynn Burton were 
unable to be present. 

The committee asked Martha 
to continue to preside at the 
meetings until the group set 
goals and began to function 
more actively. Ruth Anne con-
sented to serve as secretary. 

Members suggested that the 
terms of office be one year for 
each member, or on a year-by-
year basis. 

The next meeting will be in 
the early fall, after HB 246 has 
been settled and Martha has 
been to the August Home Ec 
teachers conference which will 
include a half day session on the 
implications of the bill for voca-
tional home economics. 

Items discussed by the group 
were: 

Purpose of the committee and 

Lazbuddie Young Home-
makers will soon be conducting 
a membership tea as part of 
their annual membership drive. 
Anyone interested in becoming 
a member is urged to contact 
any of the Lazbuddie Young 
Homemakers at this time. 

The organization has been 
active for over two decades. 
This service organization seeks 
to strengthen the family and 
community and to provide 
assistance to community mem-
bers in need. 

Through the years, Lazbuddie 
Young Homemakers have 
donated winter coats and eye-
glasses to needy children, pro-
vided for the school playground 
equipment, a television and 
video recorder, elementary 
track meet ribbons, and other 
needed items, report the mem-
bers. 

Area senior citizens are a 
special concern to the Lazbud-
die Young Homemakers. Mem-
bers visit, correspond with, and 
give gifts to these special citi-
zens. 

Although the main purpose of 
the organization is to strengthen 
and preserve the family, the 
members organize and conduct 
many worthwhile projects 
which are designed to serve the 
community. 

They have held free blood 
pressure and fingerprinting 
clinics, style shows, and chil-
dren's art and poster competi-
tions and awards. In addition, 
they arrange and preside over 
an annual Christmas Bazaar 
which promotes area artists 
and craftsmen. 

In the past, the Young Home-
makers have organized a 
school-wide reunion. They have 
collected recipes and created a 
Lazbuddie Community cook-
book. 

The main money-making pro-
ject of the organization is the 
sale of pecans in September and 
October. This money is fed back 
into the community. 

Meetings are held the first 
Thursday of every month, Sep-
tember through May. Each 
month, members have a pro-
gram which is directly related 
to the family and homemaking. 

Although DeAnn, who will be 
a junior this fall at Farwell, 
plays the mallots in the percus-
sion section of the high school 
band, she will be playing the 
base drum while on tour. 

DeAnn will depart July 9 for 
New York City, where the band 
members will meet and prac-
tice for three days. They are 
planning a concert at the 
Georgian Ball Room at the 
Penta Hotel in New York before 
they depart for Europe on July 
12. 

While in Europe, the band will 
tour cities in England, France, 
Germany, Switzerland, Hol-
land, and Italy, before return-
ing home on August 5. 

ENMU Presents 

`The Boy Friend' 

age three. 
Maternal grandparents are 

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Kelley of 
Texico, and paternal grandpar-
ents are Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Cain of Snyder, Tex. 

Great grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Homer Kelley of Texi-
co and Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Owens 
of Bovina. 

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Cain of 
Route 1, Texico, are parents of 
their second child, a daughter, 
born June 14 at 6:05 p.m. in 
Clovis High Plains Hospital. 

The new girl has been named 
Kelsi D'Aun. She weighed seven 
pounds, 11'2 ounces, and was 20 
inches long at birth. 

She has one brother, Kyle, 

Morris Family Gathers 

For Reunion In Texico 
enjoyed by all, the family mem-
bers report. 

Curt Christian, infant son of centered with an arrangement 
Vick and Denise Christian of of blue, apricot and yellow silk 
Farwell, was honored with a flowers around a clown holding 
"coming out" shower on Satur- balloons of the same colors, and 
day, June 9, at Hamlin Me- greenery. 
morial Methodist Church. 	Napkins featured a mother 

Guests were greeted by the rabbit rocking her baby with the 
▪ honoree and his mother, Denise. inscription "A baby is a pre-

Special guests were the cious treasure that fills each 
honoree's grandmother, Lillie day with endless pleasure." 
Christian; his great-grand- 	The centerpiece was part of 
mothers, Carrie Christian and the hostess gift which also in-
Katie Ellison, all of Farwell; eluded a play pen. 
and his aunt, Sharmy Christian 	Hostesses for the occasion 
of Lubbock. 	 were Robin Gregory, Diane 

Guests were served refresh- Actkinson, Dorothy Lovelace, 
ments of assorted cookies and Peggy Snider, Lee Nell Eubank, 
apricot slush punch from crys- Dorothy Quickel, Irene Jones, 
tal appointments. The table was Liz Phillips, Beth Howard, and 

• covered with an ecru cloth and Roberta Howard. 

Kirklands Attend Family Reunion 

Marriage 
Licenses 

Jack and Sue Kirkland of next year. 
Farwell traveled to Lake 	Mrs. Kirkland said that it was 
Brownwood last weekend to terribly hot there, about 104 
attend the annual Kirkland degrees each day, but that 
family reunion. The reunion is everyone had a good time in 
held each year at the Christian spite of the heat. 

a  Retreat on the lake at Brown- 
e wood. 

makes everything come out 
right in the end rounds out the 
full complement of musical 
comedy elements. 

Add to this a fair share of song 
and dance, bright costumes and 
scenery, and you have a grand 
evening of family fun. The Fine 
Arts Box Office is open for the 8 
p.m. MDT July 6, 7, 13, 14, 20 
and 21 performances. 

Tickets are $4.00, General 
Admission; $3.00, Senior Citi-
zen; $2.00, Pre-College; and 
$1.00 ENMU Student with ID. 
Summer hours for the Box 
Office are 12:00 p.m. to 4:00 
p.m. MDT at (505) 562-2710. 
Seating will be limited to 125 
people per performance. 

Center Auxiliary 

To Meet Monday 

Three marriage licenses were 
issued from the office of the 
Parmer County Clerk since the 
last report. 

Receiving the licenses were 
Gary Dale Sweatt and Deborah 
Lynn Shirley; Joel Matthew 
Edwards and Christie Arlene 
Barfield; and Joseph Earl 
Walker and Kathy Lynn Sims. 

The children and grandchil-
dren of Dewey and Lena Morris 
gathered at their home in Texi-
co June 14-16 for a family re-
union. 

Present for the occasion were 
Rose and Sherri York of Belle-
ville, Ark.; Mr. and Mrs. Rich-
ard Morris, Darla and Mike of 
Bovina; Mr. and Mrs. James 
Williams, Cheryl, Charlie and 
Jordan of Muleshoe; Lucille 
Morris and Sandra of Ola., 
Ark.; 

Also, Allene and Daniel Kim-
ball of Madisonville, Tex.; 
Carolyn, Robert and Rickey 
Hamrick of Lansing, Kan.; and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Morris of 
Texico. 

A good time of visiting was Visit Here 
Mr. and Mrs. Ira Winkler of 

Roswell visited in Texico June 
21-22 with his mother, Gracie 
Dane. 

Approximately 40 persons at-
tended the gathering, and all 
enjoyed visiting, eating, and 
relaxing, said Mrs. Kirkland. 
The big event of the weekend 
was the family auction. Family 
members bring homemade 
items such as jelly, dolls, doll 
clothes, quilts, and handcrafts 
and put them up for auction. 
Proceeds from the auction go 
into the reunion fund for the 

Farwell Convalescent Center 
Auxiliary will have their quar-
terly meeting Monday, July 2, 
at 4 p.m. at the Convalescent 
Center. 

All members and interested 
persons are urged to attend. 

"Vodee-o-do" and "doo-
wacka-doo" will be heard more 
than once this summer at the 
ENMU Theatre as the Corral 
Playhouse presents "The Boy 
Friend" the first three week-
ends in July. Set in the south of 
France in the 1920's, this musi-
cal comedy is a spoof on all the 
musical comedy conventions. 

We have the boy-gets-girl, 
boy-loses-girl, boy-gets-girl 
theme in the characters of Polly 
Browne, and Tony Brockhurst. 
Mistaken identity and suspect-
ed villainy foil their initial love 
scene. Then we have the second-
time-around love theme be-
tween Percival Browne, Polly's 
father, and Madame Dubonnet, 
proprietress of the exclusive 
finishing school Polly attends. 
We have the comic-love-match 
theme between Polly's school-
mate, Maisie, and the rich 
American, Bobby Van Husen, 
according to Karyl Lyne of 
ENMU, Office of Promotion. 

There must of course, be a 
lecherous old geezer with an eye 
for the ladies and a wife whose 
voice cracks glass at 20 yards —
enter Lord and Lady Brock-
hurst. A clever witty maid who 

Maisie, played by Holley 
Crouch of Lubbock, has some 
flapper fun in the ENMU pro-
duction of "The Boy Friend," 

July 6, 7, 13, 14, 20 and 21 at the 
University Theatre at 8 p.m. 
MDT. For tickets, call 505-562-
2710. 
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• SATURDAY NIGHT BUFFET 	: 
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: 	MS — Hot Links - Ham 	: 
Sliced Beef - Chicken  4 :. .444 

Potato Salad - Cold Slaw - Western Style Beans 

• Fried Okra - Baked Potato - Salad Bar 	
:

4: • : 

• 4. 
All You Can Eat sus 

• 
: 	SPUR RESTAURANT 	

I 
. . 

: 
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218 West 2nd 	- Muleshoe - 	806/272-3487 

Picture Perfect Baby Contest 
Two Categories: Birth to 18 Months 

18 Months to 4 Years 

Public Judging 
Deadline For Entering: 

June 30, 1984 
CALL TODAY FOR AN APPLICATION 

Sponsoring Merchants 
Latrells 

First National Bank - Clif Frame & Gallery, Sudan - Muleshoe State Bank - 

- Doll Cottage, Farwell - Citizens State Bank, Earth - The Chick-N-Dock 

Poynors - Delton E. Wilhite, Associates - Something Special 

Serving Texico C Farwell With Good Food 
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Ruud Tke Mouse 
with Laura Jacobs 

Farmer County Extension Agent 
for Home Economics 

Doc Stewart Chevrolet Buick, Inc. 
2500 Mabry Dr. 	 Clovis, N.M. 
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Texico Baptist Women Cantu Named 
To Dean's List 
LEVELLAND — Francisco 

Cantu of Farwell has been 
named to the Dean's Honor List 
at South Plains College for the 
1984 spring semester. 

To qualify as an honor student 
at SPC, students must maintain 
a minimum of 3.25 grade point 
average while enrolled for at 
least 12 semester hours. 

"We wish to extend our con-
gratulations to these fine stu-
dents who have demonstrated 
academic excellence which is 
found at South Plains College," 
said Dr. Bud Joyner, vice presi-
dent for academic affairs. "We 
are always proud of the stu-
dents who are named to the 
President and Dean's Honor 
Lists." 

A total of 130 students were 
named to the President's List, 
and 279 students to the Dean's 
List for the 1984 spring semester 
at SPC. 

Have Royal Service 

"Making Jelly" 

"You Are One in a Million," • 
with Mrs. Schlueter, Velma 
Kelley, and Mary Dell Brown 
taking part. 

A short business meeting fol-
lowed, with Director Helen 
Bowers presiding. 

Those present were Mes-
dames Nora Day, Velma Kel-
ley, Lois Hudnall, Mary Dell 
Brown, Mora Schlueter, Helen 
Bowers, and Gracie Dane. • 

Baptist Women of First Bap-
tist Church of Texico met at the 
church May 2 for their Royal 
Service program, with Chair-
man Mora Schlueter in charge. 

The program opened with 
Mary Dell Brown reading Gala-
tians 1:11-20, and then she read 
the names of missionaries hav-
ing birthdays on that day. Lois 
Hudnall led in prayer. 

Topic for the program was 

Kern Donahey On Dean's List 
includes students whose grade 
point averages are 3.25 or high-
er. 

To be eligible for the honor 
roll, a student must have com-
pleted a minimum 12 credit 
hours for the semester. • 

Farwell 1956 Graduates 
WORD of GOD 

Left to right, top to bottom: 
Jack Williams, superintendent; 
George Childress, principal; 
Laura Penrick, sponsor; Eu-
genia Murray, sponsor; Calvin 
Murray, sponsor; Elton Kesner, 
president; Gerald Hardage, 
vice-president; Jo Claire Mag-
ness, secretary; Bert Williams, 

Kern, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Donahey of 
Route 1, Texico, has earned a 
Bachelor of Business Education 
degree. 

WTSU — Kern J. Donahey, a 
1984 graduate of West Texas 
State University from Texico, 
has been named to the Dean's 
List honor roll for the spring 
semester. 

More than 100 of the 737 stu-
dents listed on the honor rolls 
have been named to the Presi-
dent's List which features stu-
dents who have earned grade 
point averages of 3.85 or higher 
on a 4.0 scale. The Dean's List 

tartaric acid, which is plentiful 
in grapes and currents, is more 
efficient for jelly-making than 
citric or acetic acid. 

Perhaps the biggest question 
in jelly-making is how much 
sugar to add, since that can 
vary from fruit to fruit. Most of 
the time, it's better to use too 
little rather than too much 
sugar if you want a jelly that 
will hold its form. 

Experiments show that three-
fourths cup of sugar per cup of 
fruit extraction works better 
than a cup or more of sugar. 
Partly ripe currants, goose-
berries and grapes may need 
one or more cups of sugar, but 
that depends on their stage of 
ripeness and the amount of 
water used to cook them. • 

Davis, Jesse Range, Truitt 
Hardage, James Norton, Wal-
lace Roberson, Betty Hubbell, 
Dean Jones, Carolyn Cantrell, 
Robert Hukill, Berna Dean 
Kube, Betty Routon, Irby 
Range, Dixie Turner, and Eddie 
Smith. 

Jerry Utsman, Marilyn Austin, 
treasurer; Venita Hobbs, 
Yaunda Dale, Dan Hammonds, 
Agnes Kriegel, Troy Christian, 
Lee Dennis Jesko, Linda Kube, 
Jimmy Schell, Ima Jean Mc-
Kellip, Betty Curtis, Patricia 
Okelberry, Dean Smith, Glenna 

Camels were used as pack animals in the American south-
west in the 1870's. 

ENMU Music Camp Registration Open 
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The "secret" to making good 
jelly is no secret at all — it's a 
combination of pectin, acid, and 
sugar in the right amounts. 
Whether you make your own 
jelly each year or you're trying 
it for the first time, it pays to 
know how these ingredients 
work together. 

Pectin determines the firm-
ness of the jelly. Too little pectin 
can produce a jelly too soft to 
hold its form. But good home-
made jellies don't have to have 
as much pectin as commercial 
jellies, which must be firm 
enough to withstand shipment. 

Different kinds of pectins pro-
duce jellies with various de-
grees of firmness. For example, 
cranberry pectins yield jellies 
that break easily into small 
clumps, while apple pectins 
create more elastic jellies. 

The acidity of the fruit also 
has something to do with firm-
ness. Juices from higher acid 
fruits yield firmer jellies than 
juices from lower acid fruits, 
even where the pectin content is 
the same. Fruits actually have 
a mixture of acids in them. But 

Having low acid or low pectin 
fruits does not mean you have to 
give up on making jelly. Low 
pectin fruits can be made into 
excellent jelly if commercial 
pectin is added. An acid can be 
increased in a fruit juice simply 
by adding lemon juice or com-
bining it with other acid fruits. 

Portales--Application and 
registration is still open for the 
Eastern New Mexico University 
Summer Music Camp '84. The 
camp will be held in Portales 
July 8-14 (Sunday through Sat-
urday). 

Junior high and senior high 
students will be given indivi-
dualized and small group in-
struction in their area--vocal, 
instrumental or piano music. 

Each participant will have 
one instrumental or vocal les-
son, two small ensemble re-
hearsals, two classes, and one 
physical activity per day. 
Classes and rehearsals are 

New Testament 
[Fulfillment] 

All this was done, 
that it might be 
fulfilled which was 
spoken by the 
prophet, saying, 

Tell 	ye 	the 
daughter of Si'on, 
Behold, thy King 
cometh unto thee, 
meek, and sitting 
upon an ass, and a 
colt the foal of an 
ass. 

Karyl Lyne, Office of Promo-
tion, College of Fine Arts, 
ENMU, Portales, NM 88130. 
(505) 562-2378. 

Mattheu 21:4,5 

scheduled throughout the day 
with time for students to prac-
tice individually. Evening acti-
vities including concerts, re-
citals, and productions are 
planned. 

Students will be housed in the 
ENMU dormitories and meals 
will be served in the Campus 
Union Building. Instrumental 
students are responsible for 
bringing their own instruments. 

Room, board and tuition are 
included in the $155 registration 
fee. Requests for registration 
forms or questions regarding 
the camp can be directed to 

FARWELL INSURANCE 

AGENCY, INC. 

We Work For You 

Box 245 - Ph. 481-9372 Farwell, Texas 

Charlie 	Florence Jones •51 
Cordially Invite You 	r; 

To Enjoy The( • 
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Golden Grain 
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Their Faith and Courage gave 
us One Nation Under God . . . 

early two centuries ago, a small group of 

men with everything to lose and possibly 

nothing to gain stood firm in 

their faith and their convictions when they 

affixed their signatures to a document the 

like of which has never been seen in all the 

history of mankind. Disregarding 

fear for their safety and, in some cases, 

their children's safety, they literally pledged 

"their lives, their fortunes and their sacred 

honor" in exchange for the many freedoms which 

you enjoy today, including the right to worship 

God in any way you choose. Avail yourself of 

this privilege for which they gave everything 

they had. 
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FAITH HAS BROUGHT US 208 YEARS 

OF INDEPENDENCE! 
\As 

Today we have a generation of those who reject a display 

of patrotism as outmoded because they have never been taught 

the significance of it: that our national symbols are revered for 

what they represent, rather than for what they are. 

Since faith was the original guiding force that put the words 

"One Nation Under God" into the Pledge ofAllegiance, you 

should honor our country by attending the Church of your 

choice and thereby enjoy one of the priceless freedoms this 

country has given to you. 

it 
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Little League Results Commissioners Court Okays 

Bid For School Land Lease Billy Joe Daniel pitched and 
Michael Arce was catcher. 

Getting hits for Kelly Green 
were Mike Robinson and Steve 
Rennhack 1 each, Lance Castle-
berry 2, Monte Delgado and 
Billy Joe Daniel 3 each, and 
Michael Arce, Hector Orozco, 
and Mike Rennhack 4 each. 

Scoring runs were Lance 
Castleberry, Billy Joe Daniel, 
Mike Robinson, and Mike Renn-
hack 2 each, Monte Delgado, 
Hector Orozco, Steve Renn-
hack, and Louis Delgado 3 each, 
and Michael Arce 4. 

Commissioner Ernest Antho-
ny presided as Chairman when 
Parmer County Commissioners 
Court met Monday, June 25, in 
regular session, due to the ill-
ness of Parmer County Judge 
Porter Roberts. 

The Court approved the ac-
ceptance of the bid from Kim-
bark Oil and Gas Company for 
the lease of Parmer County 
school land located in Gaines 
County. 

The bid in the amount of 
533,814.42 is for the NE/4 and 
S/2 of Labor 18, all of Labors 19, 
22, and 23, all in League 317, 

Kelly Green defeated Tide 
Products 15-3 on June 22. 

Pitching was Monte Delgado 
and catching was Michael Arce. 

Getting hits were Mike Renn-
hack 1, Billy Joe Daniel 2, 
Hector Orozco and Monte Del-
gado 3 each, and Lance Castle-
berry and Michael Arce 4 each. 

Runs were scored by Mike 
Rennhack, Louis Delgado, 
Steve Rennhack, and Hector 
Orozco 1 each, Mike Robinson, 
Billy Joe Daniel, Monte Del-
gado, and Lance Castleberry 2 
each, and Michael Arce 3. 

month of August, based on each 
school's average daily attend-
ance. 

Consideration of mileage 
reimbursement for Bailey 
County Judge Gordon Green 
was tabled until further infor-
mation can be obtained, Judge 
Green is handling the Parmer 
County court cases while Judge 
Roberts is absent. 

In final action, County Clerk 
Bonnie Warren presented the 
Blue Cross of Texas contract for 
employee health insurance to 
the Court, and renewal of the 
contract was approved. 

having some shelves built in the 
Adult Probation office, and 
agreed to advertise for bids to 
re-roof the Law Enforcement 
Center. 

The Court authorized Chair-
man Anthony to purchase a 
C.D. with interest received 
from C.D.s in the Available 
School Fund, to mature August 
15, 1984. This money is divided 
among the county schools in the 

Bids for the re-roofing work 
will be opened July 9 at 11 a.m. 
Specifications can be obtained 
at the County Judge's office. 

Parmer County School Land, 
Gaines County, Texas. 

Commissioner Anthony was 
authorized to execute the lease 
on behalf of Parmer County. 
This lease money will be de-
posited in the Permanent School 
Fund to earn interest for the 
county schools. 

In other business, a local resi-
dent asked the Court for help in 
going to Galveston to enter John 
Sealy Hospital. After a dis-
cussion of the need, the Court 
agreed to pay this person $200 
for travel expense to Galveston. 

The Commissioners approved 

PINTO LEAGUE (TEE BALL) 
Oklahoma Lane Farm Supply 

defeated Franse Irrigation 34-13 
on June 7. 

Scoring runs for OKFS were 
Jennie Morris 2, Reace Bennett 
3, Eric Delgado 3, Terry Askew 
4, Adam Burford 3, Nash Arm-
strong 4, Dara Jenkins 4, Clyde 
Jenkins 3, Brent Harrison 3, 
Jeremy Ortiz 4, and Kelly Del-
gado 1. 

Scoring for Franse Irrigation 
11) were Chon Arce 3, Natasha 

Shaw 1, Doug Sewell 1, Jaime 
Morton 1, Scott Smith 1, Derrick 
Harrington 2, Corey Horner 1, 
Ivan Burton 1, and Ronnie Kelly 
2. 

Oklahoma Lane Farm Supply 
defeated Farwell Hardware 
15-10 on June 11. 
• Scoring runs for OKFS were 
Jennie Morris 1, Reace Bennett 
2, Eric Delgado 2, Terry Askew 
I, Adam Burford 1, Nash Arm-
strong 1, Dara Jenkins 2, Clyde 
Jenkins 2, Brent Harrison 1, and 
Jeremy Ortiz 2. 

Scoring for Farwell Hard-
ware were Joni Hernandez 1, 
David Sizemore 1, Jeremy Stan-
ton 1, Joey Martin 2, Tyrone 
Gooden 2, Jonathen Cunning-
ham 1, and Jonas Hernandez 2. 

Oklahoma Lane Farm Supply 
I defeated Farwell Hardware on 

June 21, but scores were not 
available. 

MUSTANG LEAGUE 
Citizens Bank defeated Capi-

tol Foods 18-6 on June 21. 
Getting hits for Capitol Foods 

were Cody Monk and Mark 
Chandler, 2 hits each, and Matt 
Foster and Jeff Lynn, 1 hit each. 

Scoring runs were Brian 
a  Johnson and Mark Chandler, 1 

each, and Miguel Galvan and 
Roger Billingsley, 2 each. 

BRONCO LEAGUE 
Kelly Green Seeds defeated 

Farwell Insurance 24.3 on June 
21. 

Frank Landry at Worley Mills 
prepares to sample a load of 
new wheat brought to the eleva-
tor by W.T. Meeks of Farwell. 
The grain tested a good 10 per-
cent moisture content, with a 
test weight of 61 pounds. Meeks 

cut the wheat from his farm 
east of Farwell. While it is a bit 
too early to tell the overall yield 
average, area grainmen believe 
that the harvest this year will be 
a good one. 

Kelly Green defeated Worley 
Mills on June 25, 24-4. 

Pitching was Michael Arce 
and catching was Hector Oroz-
co. 

Getting hits were Ron Wilson, 
Mike Rennhack, Steve Renn-
hack, and Billy Joe Daniels 1 
each, Lance Castleberry 2, 
Monte Delgado and Hector 
Orozco 3 each, and Michael 
Arce 4. 

Runs were made by Michael 
Arce, Ron Wilson, and Louis 
Delgado 1 each, Mike Rennhack 
2, Steve Rennhack, Hector 
Orozco, Billy Joe Daniel, Monte 
Delgado, and Lance Castle-
berry 3 each, and Mike Robin-
son 4. 



NOTICE--Old Nick at Nick's 
Upholstery Shop in Clovis is 
beginning to make pickup seat 
covers again. Come by and let 
us make an estimate for your 
pickup and furniture needs. Call 
762-2111 or come by 209 North 
Prince in Clovis. 	43-3tc 

FARWELL 8TH GRADE 
Graduation Pictures 
May Be Picked Up 

Monday, July 9 
11 a.m. - 2 p.m. 

at the High School 
Photographer will be pres-
ent and additional selec-
tions may be made if de-
sired. If unable to pick up 
pictures on this day, they 
will be left at the high 
school office, or may be 
picked up at start of school. 

43-2k 

lecxxxximpositidl 
TRIBUNE DEADLINES. 

News and Photos 

5 p.m. Tuesday 
••• 

News of Tuesday 
night events 

9 a.m. Wednesday 

Display Ad Copy 
5 p.m. Tuesday 

.0. 

Classified Ad Copy 
Wednesday Noon 

view Add., Friona. 
DT - Jerry L. Davis - Plains 

National Bank - 1.00 ac. out 
SE/pt Sec. 33, T1OS; R2E. 

DT - Mary E. Childers -
Farmers Home Adm. - Lots 10, 
11, 12, BIk. 22, OT Farwell. 

DT - Dale and Laura Hart -
Western National Bank of Ama-
rillo - Lot 1, Blk. 1, Staley Add., 
Friona. 

DT - John L. Mitchell - First 
National Bank of Lubbock - N1/2  
Sec. 14, Kelly H. 

The tablet held in the hand 
of the Statue of Liberty 
contains a lone inscription: 
July 4, 1776. 

able by a fine not exceeding 

THREE HUNDRED DOLLARS 
($300.00) in the discretion of the 
Court. 

Passed, approved, and adopt- 
ed this the 	 day of 
	, 1984. 

City of Texico, 
a Municipal Corporation 

Need A 
New or Used 

Combine? 
See our selection of new 

AC M3's and F3's 
W/ 24 ft head W/ 20 ft. head 

Used l2, N6 & N7 
We have a really nice 1982 a that you must see. 

ALUS-04ALMERS 

Plains 
Equipment 
5400 Mabry Dr. - Clovis 

aa'S ng 
ROD WEEDERS 
Check our supply of 

rod weeders now! 

Plains Equipment 
5400 Mabry Dr. - Clovis 

Pr 

PIERCE 
REAL ESTATE 

4 8 2- 9188 
T 	X ICO, N.M. 

CHARLOTTE PIERCE, 
BROKER 

400 Craig Street 
Texico, NM 

[505]482-9188 

SOME LOTS still available in the 800 block between State 
Street and Turner Street in north Texico. 

BEAUTIFUL BRICK HOME, 2 blocks east of Texico School. 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths, double garage. Reasonable price. Shown 
by appointment only. 

IDEAL home for a single or a couple, 882 sq. ft. plus carport 
and storage or workshop building of 243 sq. ft., in addition to 
beautiful yard and many extras. Must see this one to 
appreciate it. Call for appointment. 

ROOM FOR HORSE - Garden, kids. i 1/2  acre tract south of 
Texico City Limits. Very nice 3-bedroom double wide mobile 
home with all the extras. Financing available. 

EXCELLENT LOCATION - i block east of Texico Schools. 
2-bedroom home, large living room, separate den with fire-
place, attached garage. Also on corner lot and has fenced-in 
backyard. Owner will finance. 

2 BEDROOM HOME - 520 Turner. Texico, $14,500.00. Good 
rental unit. 

2 BEDROOM HOME - 709 Lamar, Texico, $22,000.00. Owner 
will finance. 

3 BEDROOM HOME - 307 Lamar, Texico, $20,000.00. 

3 BEDR 
8°0 	

ood, Texico. $22,000. 
1. 

so FT. FRONTAGE lot with 12x60 mobile home. 804 Garwood. 
Texico. $7,000. 

FARWELL - eastern edge just outside city limits, very 
comfortable home with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, large living area 
with fireplace. Located on 2-acre tract with livestock 
facilities. 

FARWELL - 2-story log home on First Street, Farwell, with 
over 2500 sq. feet living area. 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, lots of 
storage space, with rental home on back of lot. Owner is 
ready to sell, with very reasonable price! 

FARWELL - 2-bedroom home in very good condition. 969 sq. 
ft. living area, plus carport. Very good location. Immediate 
possession available. 

Drawer 887 - 109 5th St., Farwell, Tx. 79325 

Phone 806/481-3288 

Wis""••••"••• •••••••••~W•searftea" 

licensed in Texas, New Mexico and Oklahoma 
P1/4"selliNSI•••••••••••WW•01•WW•04•••~150•0%.~0•0404101.M. 

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 

• • • 

Nice 3 bedroom. 11/2  bath home with small basement 
room. Good neighborhood. near park. Priced right, 
$16,500. 

• • • 

Nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath stucco home with garage and new 
storm windows. 

• • • 

Perfect family home, 3 bedroom, 1 bath, nice kitchen, lots 
of storage, carport and garage, fenced yard with some 
fruit trees. 

• • • 

Nice brick home in south Farwell, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
small yard with block fence, storage building, single car 
garage. Just right for the retired couple. 

INVESTMENT PROPERTY 

Brick Tri-Plex. Each unit 2 bedroom, I bath with carport. 
100% occupancy. Very nice. Possible 914% loan assump-
tion. 

FARM AND RANCH 

• • • 

Motivated seller says sell immediately. 320 acres with tw o 
8-inch wells. good water area, southwest of Bovina. $600 
per acre. 

Nice 2 bedroom, I bath home with fenced backyard, 
within walking distance of school. 

••• 

Must see this elegant 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick home in 
south Farwell. Spacious, isolated master bedroom and 
bath. Kitchen with skylights, dining room, sunken living 
room and large den, 2 fireplaces, utility room, lots of 
storage. 2 car garage with electric door. Fenced Yard. 
Great location. 

••• 

Good handyman special. Stucco, 2 bedroom. I bath home 
with garden area. Priced right. 

160 acres, 8-inch well, good water area, good farm, south-
west of Farwell. 

••• 

360 acres irrigated, five wells, three circle sprinklers. 
excellent farm. Near House. N.M. 

Long-term credit 
to buy 
or improve land. 
When you make the land your life 	you 
need to look for a specialist when selecting a 
lender At your Federal Land Bank 
Association our specialty is long-term credit 
to agriculture Al the Land Bank we 
have funds to help The  
you finance 
a sound project Land 

Bank ,:tv•ktte 
LAND BANK 
e•f•-•••aw 

Close to the land 
and the people who work it 

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 
Bill Liles, Manager 
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Courthouse Notes Letter To 
The Editor 

June 19, 1984 

CLASSIFIEDADs John Getz, Editor 
Farwell State Line Tribune 
Farwell, TX 79325 

• 

• 

S 

• 

• 

DIRTY CARPETS? Call Rain-
bow, 825-2847 after 5 p.m. Liv-
ing-dining area, $29.95. Addi-
tional room, $14.95. Free esti-
mates. Jerry and Flo Davis. 

35-ftnc 

NEW SCHAFFER DISK 
PARTS 

Dear John, 

I would like to ask why 
nothing has been in the paper 
concerning the closing of a 
landmark in our town. Last 
week, Rose Drug closed its 
doors. From my recollections 
and from visiting with Claude 
Sr., I found out that Rose Drug 
has been in business for 56 
years. I understand that before 
that the same building housed a 
drug store called Fox Drug. 

I realize that a new business 
opening in town is a cause for 
great excitement and interest 
but the closing of a landmark 
should be of some news. Pos-
sibly you could find some space 
in your Border Town Days 
issues for a story on this. 

I for one will miss Rose Drug. 
Not just because of the conven-
ience of having my prescrip-
tions filled but for the friendli-
ness I found there. All of the 
Rose family has been a source 
of friendship to me since I was a 
small girl. You could always 
meet up with someone to visit 
with while waiting on a pre-
scription. To me, we have lost 
more than a drug store but a 
meeting place to say "Hi" to 
some neighbors. 

 

Disc Rolling Service 
Call 505/389-5163 

Tandem, Offset, One Way 
Any Size, Any Style 
On or Off Tractor 

Complete bearing inspection 
and repair. 

39-tfnc 

 

PORTABLE WELDING 

For your welding needs, call 

HAROLD CHARLSON 

ASME Qualified 	825-3901 
42-tfnc 

17 New-Used Tractors 

'76 915 IHD 24' Diesel. '69 ACG 
20' LP. 8 yd Hancock scraper. 
Harsh mixer feeder box. Used 
tractor & combine parts. 2 IHC 

Trucks 20' bed & hoist, 843 JD 
cornhead. 444 JD cornhead. 

ROOFING & REPAIR 

Reasonable Reference 

CALL SAM 

505/359-0512 
Portales,  NM 

42-2k 

S & S Lawn Care 
Scalping, Mowing, Edging, 
Spraying and Fertilizing. 

Call 
481-3403 

24-tfnc 

13 Acres Machinery 
BIG NICK MACHINERY 

BOVINA, TEXAS 
238-1614 	Night 218-1450 

T6S; R3E. 
WD - Woodrow W. Adcock -

Donald H. Fortenberry - W 60 
ac. of E 140 ac. Sec. 18, Blk. B, 
Rhea Bel. 

WD - Raymond Jones - Billy 
Ray Jones - S 5 ft. Lot 7 & all Lot 
8, 9, 10, 11, 12, Jones Add., 
Friona. 

WD - Tony Granado - Lorenzo 
Granado - Lot 6, Blk. 6, Drake 
Rev., Friona. 

••• 

Instrument report ending 
June 20, 1984, in County Clerk 
office, Bonnie Warren, County 
Clerk. 

WD - Roland D. Dale - Jerry 
Davis - 1.00 ac. out SE/pt Sec. 
33, TICS; R2E. 

WD - Sharon Kay Miller - Roy 
Miller - SW1/4  Sec. 3, Blk. V, 
Oliver. 

WD - Edith Corrigan & 
Frankie Anneta Thompson -
Roy M. Miller - SW1/4  Sec. Blk. 
V, Oliver. 

WD - Johnny Actkinson -
Mary E. Childers - Lots 10, 11, 
12, Blk. 22, OT Farwell. 

WD - Cresencio & Dianna R. 
Corral - Maria Cruz Perez - Lot 
8, Blk. 3, Friona. 

WD - Rex F. Johnston - David 
Grimsley - SW1/4  Sec. 11, TIN; 
R4E. 

WD - Steve & Seva F. Struve -
David & Uldene Grimsley - 
SE1/4  Sec. 10, T1N; R4E. 

WD - John W. & Dianne 
Tannahill - Dale & Laura Hart -
Lot 1, Blk. 1, Staley Add., 
Friona. 

WD - Ruben Villanueve -
Emma Villanueve - W 20 ft. Lot 
4; E 40 ft., Lot 5, BIk. 1, Ridge- 

Instrument report ending 
June 13, 1984, in County Clerk 
office, Bonnie Warren, County 
Clerk. 

WD - Bernice Hartzog - Tom-
mie Williams - Undivided 1,;2  
interest in and to all of Lots 1 & 2 
BIk. 10, Bovina. 

WD - Brian W. & Zoe Ann 
Tabor - L.D. & Flossie Knight -
N. 51.13 ac. of SW1/4 , Sec. 7, T6S; 
R3E. 

WD - Marciano L. Escalante 
Jr. - Amelia Cisneros - W 80 ft. 
Lot 7 & W 80 ft. Lot 8, Blk. 87, OT 
Friona. 

WD - Amelia Cisneros - Gary 
D. Cash - Tract out NW corner 
Sec. 5, T4S; R-. 

WD - Floyd L. Rector - Nick 
Collier - Part of Sec. 32, T4S; 
R4E. 

WD Neoma Oldham - Nick 
Collier - E 120 ac. of NE1/4  Sec. 
32, T4S; R4E. 

WD E.R. Coffman - Melody 
Drake - Lots 29, 30, 31, 32, Blk. 
42, OT Farwell. 

WD - Wanda Bunn - Alfred F. 
Walker & Ralph Madrid - Lots 4 
& 5, Blk. 3, OT Farwell. 

WD - Wayne Pierce - Hurshel 
R. Harding - Lots 12, 13, 14, Blk. 
27, OT Farwell. 

WD - Tommy Williams - J.B. 
& Jay B. Barrett - Lots 1 & 2, 
Blk. 104, OT Bovina & pt. of Ave. 
I. 

WD - Sharyle Moore Meason -
B.F. Ray - Lots 16 & 17, Blk. 68, 
OT Bovina. 

WD - Billie Long Homer, 
Eldon K. Long, Tommie Dale 
Long & Sheryl L. Snead - Billy 
Dean Bakter - NE!/4  Sec. 27, 

HOME FOR SALE by owner. 2 
bedroom, newly remodeled, 
fully carpeted, fenced in back 
yard, single car garage, 605 -
3rd Street, Farwell. Call 481- 
3235 or 481-3270. 	30-tfnc 

Legal Notice ROUND-UP 
Application 

30- or 40-inch rows 

Cotton, Mbo, Soybeans 

Pipe Wick Mounted 
On High Boy 

Call Roy O'Brian 
806-265-3247 

Friona, Texas 43-linc 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

Bids will be taken until 11:00 
a.m., July 9, 1984 for reroofing 
the Parmer County Law En-
forcement Center in Farwell, 
Texas. Specifications may be 
picked up at the office of the 
County Judge in the Court-
house. 

Bids should be mailed to 
County Commissioners Court, 
Box 506, Farwell, Texas 79325; 
or delivered in person to the 
County Judge's office at the 
Courthouse in Farwell, Texas, 
prior to 11:00 a.m, on July 9, 
1984 at which time bids will be 
opened. 

The Commissioners Court of 
Parmer County reserves the 
right to accept or reject any or 
all bids. 

By order of the Commission-
ers Court of Parmer County. 

Sincerely, 
Lena Cole 

GARAGE SALE-Five family. 
Furniture, clothes, dishes, and 
miscellaneous. Sat. and Sun., 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. 413 - 7th St., Far- 
well. 	 43-1tc 

Legal Publications 
CITY OF TEXICO 

ORDINANCE NO. 225 
MONTY CORBIN 
d/b/a SPECIALTY BEDS, INC. 

GREETING: 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: 

JIM PREINER 
d/b/a FARM COMBINING 

THREE FAMILY garage sale-
Saturday, June 30, 8-6; and Sun- 
day, July 1, 1-5. Lots of bar-
gains! 500 Craig in Texico.43-1tp 

GREETING: 

Be it ordained by the govern- 
ing body that is, The City Com-
mission of the City of Texico in 
the County of Curry, State of 
New Mexico, that: 

It shall be unlawful for any 
person to drink or use any al-
coholic liquors of any kind in 
any public poolroom, dance 
hall, bowling alley, or in any 
street, or in any other public 
place within the corporate 
limits of the city including but 
not limited to parks, public 
offices, property controlled by 
the city, and other places open 
to the public. It shall be pre-
sumed subject to rebuttal at 
trial that possession of an open 
container or possession of a 
container with a broken seal is 
being "used" as defined and 
proscribed herein. A violation of 
this ordinance shall be punish- 

HELP WANTED-Need some-
one to hoe and work in yard 
Saturday. Call 481-3845. 	43-1tc Parmer County 

Commissioners Court JOHN R. HADLEY, Mayor 
City of Texico, New Mexico CARD OF THANKS 

I would like to express my 
appreciation to everyone who 
thought of me during my illness. 

Gerald Norton 
43-1tc 

MARIE CHRISTIAN, 
City Clerk 
City of Texico, New Mexico 

Published in State Line Tribune 
June 29, July 6, 1984. 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

Farwell Hospital District will 
accept bids until 5 p.m. on July 
6, 1984 for roofing work at Far-
well Convalescent Center. 

Bids should be mailed to Far-
well Hospital District, Box 177, 
Farwell, Texas 79325, or contact 
Ron Fechner at the Conva-
lescent Center, 481-9027. 

Farwell Hospital District re-
serves the right to accept or re-
ject any or all bids. 

Farwell Hospital District 

Published in State Line Tribune 
June 29, 1984. 

Published in State Line Tribune 
June 22, 29, 1984. 

Classified Ads 

Get Results 
••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••41W"W~•~41••••• 
P•MIY"PNINININININIW•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sports-
wear, Ladies Apparel, Com-
bination, Accessories, Large 
Size store. National brands: 
Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, Van-
derbilt, Izod, Gunne Sax, Es-
prit, Brittania, Calvin Klein, 
Sergio Valente, Evan Picone, 
Claiborne, Members Only, Bill 
Blass, Organically Grown, 
Healthtex, 600 others. $7,900 to 
$24,900, inventory, airfare, 
training, fixtures, grand open-
ing, etc. Mr. Loughlin (612) 888- 
6555. 	 43-1tp 

Marjorie Watkins, 
District Clerk 
Court Parmer County, Texas 
By Dorothy Lovelace, Deputy 

Published in State Line Tribune 
June 8, 15, 22, 29, 1984. 

••• 

160 acres 	it'nch electrl 	II, circle sprinkler, 
fenced. sou 	 resell. 

••• 

480 acres, 3 submergible wells, with 405-acre cotton allot-
ment. $51 government payment per acre. 

You are commanded to ap-
pear by filing a written answer 
to the plaintiff's petition at or 
before 10 o'clock A.M. of the 
first Monday after the expira-
tion of 42 days from the date of 
issuance of this Citation, the 
same being Monday the 16th 
day of July, A.D., 1984, at or 
before 10 o'clock A.M., before 
the Honorable District Court of 
Parmer County, at the Court 
House in Farwell, Texas. 

Said plaintiff's petition was 
filed on the 8th day of Septem-
ber, 1983. The file number of 
said suit being No. 5419. 

The names of the parties in 
said suit are: 

HELTON OIL, INC. as Plain-
tiff, and JIM PREINER d/b/a 
FARM COMBINING as De-
fendant. 

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit: 

The suit alleges a debt obli-
gation by Defendant owed to 
Plaintiff. 

If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved. 

Issued this the 30th day of 
May, A.D., 1984. 

Given under my hand and 
seal of said Court, at office in 
Farwell, Texas, this the 30th 
day of May, A.D., 1984. 

You are commanded to ap-
pear by filing a written answer 
to the plaintiff's petition at or 
before 10 o'clock A.M. of the 
first Monday after the expira-
tion of 42 days from the date of 
issuance of this Citation, the 
same being Monday the 16th 
day of July, A.D., 1984, at or 
before 10 o'clock A.M., before 
the Honorable District Court of 
Parmer County, at the Court 
House in Farwell. Texas. 

Said plaintiff's petition was 
filed on the 28 day of March, 
1984. The file number of said 
suit being No. 5513. 

The names of the parties in 
said suit are: 

STEVEN HANES and K.B.C. 
SALES, INC., d/b/a CARDI-
NAL EQUIPMENT COMPANY 
as Plaintiff, and MONTY COR-
BIN d/b/a SPECIALTY BEDS, 
INC. as Defendant. DISTRICT 
COURT CLERK OF PARMER 
COUNTY, TEXAS as Garnish-
ee. 

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit: 

The suit is a garnishment 
action wherein the garnishee 
holds certain personal property 
which may belong to the De-
fendant and is subject to post-
judgment garnishment by 
Plaintiff. 

If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved. 

Issued this the 30th day of 
May, A.D., 1984. 

Given under my hand and 
seal of said Court, at office in 
Farwell, Texas, this the 30th 
day of May, A.D., 1984. 

Marjorie Watkins, 
District Clerk 
Court Parmer County, Texas 
By Dorothy Lovelace, Deputy 

Published in State Line Tribune 
June 8, 15, 22, 29, 1984. 

,gib 
Sudderth Realty, Inc. 

• • • 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 160 acres, one 8-inch well, good water area, east of Bovina. 
• • • 

160 acres west of Bovina, two wells, one pump. Priced at 
$290 per acre. Owner says sell immediately and will 
finance. 

TO: 

160 acres irrigated, two 8-inch wells with Zimmatic 
sprinkler, southeast of Farwell. 

••• 

214 acres. One 8-inch well, one-half mile off highway. 
Oklahoma Lane area. 

• • • 

250 acres. Two 8-inch wells. Near Farwell, near highway. 
Good farm. 

• • • 

1280 acres with seven 8-inch wells. two circles. Beautiful 3 
bedroom, 2 bath home, nice barn, on highway, good water 
area, near Lazbuddie. 

••• 

320 acres irrigated, three 8-inch wells, two electric circle 
sprinklers. Approx. 200 feet to water, and approx. 200 feet 
of water. Owner says sell immediately. Bargain farm in 
Pleasant Valley area. 
••••••••••••••••••••••••••"• ••••••••••••• 

We Specialize in Estates 
/16•••••••• ar 

SAVING IS GREAT 

INVEST IN REAL ESTATE. 
"Sales and Loans Are Our Ser 
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imam 
JOIN THkuzer  st EATING TEAM 

PRICES EFFECTIVE JUNE 24 THROUGH JUNE 30, 1984. 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT. SHURFRESH BONELESS FULLY COOKED 

HAM. 
IC 89 

CALIFORNIA 
LONG WHITE ALL PURPOSE Open 

July 4th 
BAGGED ICE 

PICNIC 
SUPPLIES 
WATER 
MELONS 

POTATOES 
93% FAT FREE 
3 TO 4 LB. AVG. 

LB. 

SHURFRESH ASST'D. VARIETIES 
THIN SLICED SMOKED 

SHURFRESH 
QUALITY MEAT 

1202. 894 
PKG. 39'  

$119 

994  
71/2 0z 994 

CTN.  

21/2  OR 3 MEATS FRANKS OZ. PKG. 

CALIF.  

NECTARINES LB.494  
LA GRANDE SHURFRESH 

QUAUTY 
SHURFRESH 
QUALITY SLICED 

12 OZ $ 1 09 
BOLOGNA PKG. 

8 OZ. HAM SALAD CTN. 

PLUMS 	Li3.39 
CALIFORNIA SANTA ROSA 	

4 SHURFRESH 
QUAUTY CHICKEN 

SHURFRESH ASST'D. VARIETIES 
YOUR CHOICE LUNCHEON 694  8 OZ.  

CTN. 
6 OZ 
PKG SALAD MEATS 

39 
RED HEART FREESTONE 

PEACHES 	LB. 	4 
 

SHURFRESH PIMENTO OR 
JALAPENO CHEESE 

SHURFRESH 
SLICED COOKED 

607. $ 1 39 
PKG. BELL PEPPERS LB.494  

CALIF. WONDER LARGE 
SPREAD HAM 
SHURFRESH FINEST QUALITY 
REG. OR HOT WHOLE HOG PORK $ 	49 
SAUSAGE IT'SW!  ROLL  I LB. 

NE  

SHURFRESH 
SLICED CHOPPED 

607. $ 1 09 
PKG. 

ITALIAN SWEET 

RED ONIONS LB. 294  HAM 

SOFT DRINKS 
• . • • 

II AND B0* 

ASST'D. 
FLAVORS 

ASST'D. 
FLAVORS 

SHURFINE SHURFRESH 

SOFT 
DRINKS 

1C2  Ali 	9c 

ICE 
CREAM 

$139 
1/ 2  GAL. 

SQ. CTN. =c 

... SHURFINE GRANULATED 

	

---AR 1 SUGAR 	 COFFEE -,i6-,,, SU GAR 

	

58,LAt $149 	
16 OZ. $799 	TUNASe OIL PAK 

WATER PAK 69  
6% OZ. 	 c 

Pr  	I P 	

CAN 	 CAN 

DILL PICKLES 
32 OZ. 79C 

JAR 

SHURFINE HAMBURGER SLICED SHURFINE CHUNK SHURFINE ASSTD. GRINDS 

LIGHT TUNA 

FROZEN & DAIRY HANDY HELPERS SHELF SAVER BARGAINS 

SHURFRESH BTRMILK/OLD FASHION 	$ 1 

BISCUITS 	6 CAI S  
SHURFINE CHARCOAL 

BRIQUETS  10 1_13 $ 1 19 
BAG  

'.111 HI I N I 

MACARONI & CHEESE 
DINNERS 	4 7.205g 694 	SHURFRESH ENGLISH 

MUFFINS 	11 OZ. 694 
PKG. 

SHURFINE 

BLEACH 1 GAL 
JUG 

$179 OIL n I 

59 	SHURFRESH ORANGE DANISH 

ROLLS 	1302.  994 
PKG 

SHURFINE SHOESTRING 	
101 

POTATOES41.5s",80. .# 
SHURFINE ASST'D. %HEIM INI \ I GI I \ 111 I 

NAPKINS 140 CT 
PKG. 

SHURFINE ASST'D VARIETIES 

JELLY (1)ARM 	
18 O

JARZ. 
79  

sHURI INF SEE/FEED THROWN MANZ. 894  
OLIVES 	SIZE . 

SHURFRESH IND. WRAP SLICED $ 	29 CHEESE FOODAMER. 1O2 
Z. 

SHURFRESH HALFMOON CHEDDAR $ 	99 
CHEESE 	16 OZ. 

PKG. 

SEWN! INI 111MA 10 

SAUCE 5 99' 30 CT. 794 
BOX 

SHURFINE GARBAGE 

BAGS 
IM11 `,,\ I 11,41 	 10I4 

CRACKERS 2 	.# .# 4 ROLL 894 
PKG. 

NICE 'n SOFT BATHROOM 

TISSUE ACCENTS 

$ 1 99  TEA BAGS II I 
\ 

,III NI INI 

MUSTARD 2 1,6Z 894  TOWELS 	 JUMBO 49 
ROLL 

ZEE DECORATED PAPER 	 4 
SHURFINE BABY 

WIPES 	 150 ZECT 
SI  

SHURFINE ALUMINUM 

FOIL 

SIZE 394  
894  
894  
594  
594  
59,  

SHURFRESH FRENCH ONION SHURF 1611 

DIP 
s111 HI INI ASS I 1) VARIETIES 

COOKIES 	A
SIZES
ssrp. 994 $1 69 

MILK 	 89' SHURE INF I VAPORA 1111 

SHURFINI 01 It I 

SHURFINE FROZEN ORANGE 
12 OZ. 
CAN JUICE 

2  ASST  SIZES 99' 
441.1 794  

16 01 $ 1 59 
BTL.  

12.25' 994 el 
BOXES 79< CREAMER 11IA R 

SHURFINE FROZEN CONC. APPLE 61114* INF ASST'D VARIETIES 

JUICE 	12 OZ. CANDY CAN 

SHURFINI 

APPLESAUCE GLASS 694  
SHURFINE LIQUID PINK/LEMON 	694  
DETERGENT 213.11!.  

SHURFINE FROZEN WHIPPED SHI 101N1 BEAL I( 
8 OZ. TOPPING PEPPER CTN. 

1 $ 1 99 DETERGENT 6.1°L L. 
•-) 01 9 

CANS
94  

46 01 99 
SHURFINE FROZEN SPEARS SHURFINE MANDARIN 

ORANGES 
SHURFINE PINEAPPLE 

JUICE 

SHURFINE DISPENSER SHURFINE LIQUID LAUNDRY 
10 OZ. BROCCOLI BABY OIL PKG. 

16 OZ $
1  1 

BTL. 	

9 	SHURFINE FABRIC SHEETS 69' SHURFINE FROZEN SHURFINE BABY 

SHAMPOO 10 OZ 
PKG 

20 CT 
BOX CUT OKRA SOFTENER CAN 

ArAFFILIATED 
FCODS INC. er - 

900 Ave. A 
Farwell 
Ph. 481.3432 

Open Til 9 o'clock Every Night 

We Redeem 1.I.S.D.A. Food Stamps 
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Sherley-Anderson Grain Co.-Lariat 	I 
I. 
I 
I 
I 
1. 
I 

Sherley Grain Co. - Bovina 

. 

• 
Sherley - Anderson 

Sherley-Anderson Rhea 	Elevator 	 Lazbaddie Elevator 	
• I , 

	

JOE & MARTHA AIM 	 DAVID ANDERSON JERRY BARBER-RAY STANLEY 

mwo 	 ow 	 sm 	 Em NEN um 	 imm imm NEL% 

Ready To Serve Yon This Harvest Season 	I 

I 

Sherley-Anderson-Pitman, Inc.-Farwell 
JUKE WILLIAMS-FRED CHANDLER-BOBBIE McFARLAND 

SERVING PARMER COUNTY 
FARMERS THE YEAR 'ROUND 

LONNIE McFARLAND-DON GARDEN 

• 
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