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To advise city council - 

icial visit 
District Governor Si Nanninga of 
Albuquerque, center, was guest 
speaker at the noon luncheon meet-
ing of Texico-Farwell Rotary Club 
Wednesday, Aug. 1, at the Spur 
restaurant. Welcoming the Gover-
nor of District 522 of Rotary Inter- 

Civic groups consider 

center's policy, fees national is Martin Chandler. left, 
local club president. Accompanying 
the governor on his visit was Frank 
Murray of Clovis, right, District 
Governor's representative from 
Region 6. Wives of the Rotarians 
were special guests at the meeting. 

In this issue is the announcement 
that Joann and I have sold the State 
Line Tribune to new owners. We will 
introduce the Pomper family to our 
readers later this month, after they 
arrive in town. 

Before we lay down the quill, we 
have two projects that we would like 
to discuss and leave with the com-
munity. These concern two things 
that we feel are important to the 
long term betterment of Farwell 
and possibly to Texico. 

In the past, we have commented 
that the small rural towns are losing 

10 	out in the political battle for repre- 
sentation in both State and National 
governments. Beyond question, 
politicians listen to the places that 
have the voters. However, there is 
one important thing, and that is to 
have the eligible voters go to the 
polls on election day and vote. 

In crucial district or state-wide 
political races, the margin of vic-
tory can be quite thin. Witness the 
past elections in Texas where only a 
very few votes decided important 
political races. A 90 percent turnout 
of voters in Parmer County might 
possibly have given the nod to Kent 
Hance in his last race. 

In John Tower's previous race for 
the U.S. Senate, a few thousand 
votes out of almost two million put 
him back in office. The Texas Water 
Bond vote of ten years ago could 
have carried, had all those in favor 
of it in the Panhandle voted that 

▪ day. 
The history of elections are re-

pleat with narrow victories, ala 
Landslide Lyndon, in hotly contest-
ed races. If a candidate running for 
office knows that an area will turn 
out its voters, then we believe that 
that area will receive due con-
sideration from that office holder 
during his years in office. 

We would like to see this corn- 

, 
munity organize a "get out the 
vote" campaign this fall for the 
general elections. A group similar 
to the Border Town Days Commit-
tee could be formed with the pur-
pose of having everybody in Farwell 
and Texico get to the polls on voting 
day. This will be a large under-
taking but one that could bear lots of 
beneficial fruit in the years ahead. 

Even national publicity could ac-
crue if the Twin Cities came up with 

• 95 percent of their eligible voters 
casting ballots this fall. Certainly 
those running for office in the future 
would give us considerable atten-
tion in their election campaigns. 

Small towns must make up for 
their lack of population by getting 
their citizens to the polls. If they 
don't, then the political future for 
the rural areas looks quite bleak. 

Next, we would like to see the City 
of Farwell expand its City Council to 

▪ five members or possibly seven 
from the present three. The recent 
embroilago concerning the renew-
ing of the TV Cable franchise points 
to the advisibility of a bigger 
representation of the people on the 
governing body. 

We think that it is unfair to put the 
burden of government on so few 
commission members. All in the 
community benefit from the muni-
cipal government, more ought to 
share in the responsibilities rather 
than heap the load on three as at 
present. 

We also think that sooner or later 
Big Brother will come along and 
force some kind of a change that 
possibly would not be to our liking. 
Better we should do it first and not 
have to accept a court order. 

This is not a new idea by several 
years, but somewhere along the line 
this subject keeps getting side- 

., tracked and nothing gets done to 
further the project. It is now time 
for action by the concerned authori-
ties. 

While such a change may be diffi-
cult, it is not impossible. This 
change will benefit everybody, cer-
tainly those who accept this difficult 
job as part of their civic duty. 

tract signed by school official. 
All civic clubs, organizations, or 

merchants of the Twin Cities could 
pay a $50 yearly fee, and then pay 
one-fourth of the rate for any non 
money-making meeting. 

A clean up deposit of $50 for 
anyone who has not paid the yearly 
fee of $50. 

These and other ideas were dis-
cussed by those in attendance, and a 
committee was appointed to formu-
late and set policies and rental fees 
for the Center, which will be pre-
sented to the City. 

Members of the committee are 
Chairman Martin Chandler of the 
Rotary club; Julia Symcox of Far-
well Study Club, Pam Smith of Beta 
Sigma Phi, Maxine Williams of 
ESA, Lynn Burton of Farwell 
Schools, and Walter Hughes, repre-
senting the businesses. 

Committee members request that 
anyone who is interested or has 
ideas or input for operating the 
Center to call and let any of the 
above persons know of these sug-
gestions. 

The committee will discuss all 
suggestions and guidelines which 
were presented at Tuesday night's 
meeting and hopes to have a com-
pleted plan to be presented at the 
next meeting of the group. 

Next meeting of the representa-
tives of all civic and social groups 
will be Tuesday, Aug. 14, at 5:30 
p.m. at Security State Bank. 

Those attending the meeting were 
Prentice Mills, Walter Hughes, 
Maxine Williams, Joe Jones, Martin 
Chandler, Curtis and Pam Smith, 
Frances Kube, Doyle Green, Joe 
Hughes, Eddie Smith, Julia Sym-
cox, Gladys Hardage, Fred Chand-
ler, Jerry Monk, Cynthia Thigpen, 
John Getz, LaMoin Williams, and 
Gary Patterson. 

posal said, in part, that: 
"The Coliseum should be made 

available to all people regardless of 
age, sex, creed, national origin, 
political persuasion, financial or 
social status. 

"The Coliseum will not be used for 
commercial purposes, that is, no 
individual, business, or private cor-
poration may use it for individual, 
business or corporate profit, such as 
garage sales, vegetable stands, pri-
vate auctions, or other forms of 
commercial merchandising. 

"This is not designed to prohibit 
equipment and automobile shows, 
livestock shows, art shows, and 
other forms of public exhibitions, 
even though such activities might 
result in some sales. 

"No alcoholic beverages of any 
description will be allowed on the 
premises at any time. No intoxi-
cated person will be allowed on the 
premises. 

"All groups or persons using the 
facility will be responsible for see-
ing that these rules are observed. 
Any group, person, or organization 
that fails to comply with them will 
thereby jeopardize their right to 
further use of the facility." 

These points were generally ac-
cepted and a discussion was held 
concering fees to be charged. The 
Rotary Club submitted a schedule 
which was discussed, and it called 
for: 

Use of Library Room ( North 
Meeting Room) for three hours at 
$50, plus $10 for each hour over 
three. 

South Meeting Room for three 
hours at $60, plus $12 for each hour 
over three. 

Large Room for three hours at 
$100, plus $15 per hour over three. 

Schools: All fees free to any 
school-sponsored function if con- 

Tuesday afternoon of this week, 19 
representatives of the various civic 
and social groups in Farwell met at 
Security State Bank to submit 
recommendations to the Farwell 
City Council concerning use and 
fees of the new Farwell Community 
Center. 

Each club and organization was 
asked to send a representative to 
the meeting to help in formulating 
rules and policy concerning how the 
new building would be used, and 
how much should be charged for 
such use. The various groups were 
asked for their advice because it 
was felt these organizations would 
use the facility the most in the long 
run. 

Joe Jones, who has been in charge 
of the renovation of the building, 
acted as chairman for the meeting. 
Jones had procured a copy of the 
"Operational Guidelines" for the 
Bailey County Exhibition Center 
and Coliseum in Muleshoe. 

The Texico-Farwell Rotary Club 
also submitted a list of ideas con-
cerning the fees which they would 
rrom mend that the City charge for 
use of all or parts of the Center. 
These recommendations were used 
as a guide to the thinking on how 
Farwell should use its Center. 

The Bailey County guideline pro- 

Effective Sept. 1 - - 

I 
Tribune to have 

new ownership 
John and Joann Getz, longtime 

publishers of the State Line Tri-
bune, announce this week that they 
have sold their newspaper to Mike 
and Judy Pomper of Blacksburg, 
Virginia. The sale of the paper will 
be effective September 1. 

Pomper is a veteran newspaper-
man, having won awards in the 
Indiana Newspaper Association, the 
Virginia Newspaper Association, 
and the National Newspaper Asso-
ciation. He and his family are 
coming to Farwell from Blacksburg 
where he has been executive editor 
of the News Messenger, a daily 
newspaper in that city. 

The Pomper family is expected to 
arrive in Farwell about the 20th of 

August and assume ownership of 
the Tribune on September 1. Pomp-
er, who visited in Farwell on July 1, 
expressed pleasure with the com-
munity and said he and his family 
hope to spend at least the next 30 
years operating the Tribune. 

The Getzes plan to remain in Far-
well as it is their home after 36 
years here. They will work closely 
with the Pompers for some time, to 
help them become acquainted in the 
area and with the operation of a 
weekly newspaper. 

The State Line Tribune is the 
oldest continuously operating busi-
ness in Texico-Farwell, and will 
soon start its 73rd year of publica-
tion. 

Registration next week at Texico 
Registration for the 1984-85 school 

term at Texico Schools begins next 
week, with the school sessions 
scheduled to begin on Monday, Aug. 
20. 

First day of registration will be 
Monday, Aug. 13, when 6th, 7th, and 
8th graders are to enroll. 

to the Texico school district should 
register at the elementary office 
from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m. the week of 
August 13-17, says George Herring-
ton, elementary principal. 

Students who have attended Texi-
co Elementary before will register 
on the first day of classes. 

Juniors and seniors will register 
Tuesday, Aug. 14; and 9th and 10th 
graders will register Wednesday, 
Aug. 15. 

On all three days, students should 
register from 8:30 to 3 p.m. MDT in 
the high school building. 

Elementary students who are new 

Farwell sets registration Aug. 21 
Farwell High School students will 

register on Tuesday, Aug. 21, for the 
1984-85 school term which will begin 
Monday, Aug. 27. 

Lynn Burton, high school princi-
pal, lists the following schedule for 
all high school students: 

Seniors will register at 9 a.in., 
juniors at 10:30 a.m., sophomores at 
1 p.m., and freshmen at 2:30 p.m. 

Band uniforms will be issued at 
the same time at the end of each 
registration. 

Students need to report to the high 

school auditorium at their sched-
uled time to pick up their registra-
tion packet. 

All new students in the area will 
need to pre-register at the high 
school office on Monday, Aug. 20, 
between the hours of 9 a.m. and 12 
noon. 

Students must have their Health 
records on required immunizations 
completed before entering school on 
Monday, the 27th, says Burton. 

Returning junior high students 

and elementary students need not 
pre-enroll. 

Elementary students, first 
through the fifth grade, who have 
not attended Farwell schools be-
fore, or kindergarten students who 
did not pre-enroll, are to register 
Tuesday, Aug. 21, at 1:30 p.m., 
according to James Craig, elemen-
tary principal. 

School will start at the regular 
time on August 27 at 8:25 a.m., and 
dismiss at 3:40 p.m. 

Mule Day Festival scheduled Saturday 
Hitch up your fastest mules and 

swiftest turtles. Polish up your 
fiddles, get out your dancing shoes 
and pack along your putters. It's 
time for the annual Mule Day Festi-
val in Muleshoe, say the organizers. 

The Mule Day Festival, scheduled 
for Saturday, Aug. 11, is one entire 
day of activities and celebrations, 
with proceeds to benefit Girlstown, 
U.S.A. at Whiteface. 

The day's activities begin at 6 
a.m. with an Omelet Race breakfast 

• Top of Texas names 

3 Steers to honor roll 
Getting the new look 

Farwell Steers Jesse Anzaldua, 
Kevin Owen, •and Roger Robertson 
have been named to the "Top of 
Texas" magazine's football honor 
roll, for their play during the 1983-84 

ti season. 
Anzaldua won the honor as defen-

sive lineman, _Owen as defensive 

afternoon, Chubby and the Com-
ancheros will perform. 

Parade awards will include first, 
second and third place cash prizes 
to winning entries in the Senior and 
Junior Riding Clubs, antique car 
entries, and for the entry judged 
best of show. 

All prizes will be awarded at the 
Mule Rodeo beginning at 1 p.m. The 
parade line-up will begin promptly 
at 9 a.m. at the Boy Scout grounds 
and the parade will follow at 10 a.m. 

For further parade entry infor-
mation, contact Dianne Nieman at 
Box 84, Muleshoe, Texas 79347 or 
call: 806-272-5286 or 272-5285. 

The Mule Rodeo will feature the 
following events: steer roping, cut-
ting contest, calf roping, barrel 
racing, steer roping, pole bending, 
hide dragging, coon mule jumping 
and mule pulling. The jackpot team 
roping is scheduled for Friday 
night, August 10, at 6 p.m. Stalls will 
be available both nights for horses 
and mules. 

linebacker, and Robertson as defen-
sive halfback. 

The magazine also made its pre-
dictions in District 2-A North for the 
upcoming season, picking Vega 
first, Nazareth second, and Farwell 
third. 

able stage is being completed, and 
the rear storage rooms are being 
framed up. The meeting rooms have 
attractive wallpaper on the walls as 
does the lobby, and the stalls have 
arrived for completion of the rest-
rooms. The only major finishing left 
to be done is installing new floor 
covering, but the Center is ready for 
use. 

and continue through the annual 
dance that evening. All events will 
take place two miles east of Mule-
shoe on Highway 70 and 112 mile 
south at the Smith barn, unless 
otherwise noted. 

6 a.m., Omelet races (breakfast); 
6:30 a.m., Hot air balloon races; 8 
a.m., Ten kilometer run; 8 a.m., 
Scramble golf tourney (Muleshoe 
Country Club); 8:30 a.m., Turtle 
races; 9 a.m., Arts and Crafts festi-
val; 

9 a.m., Parade line-up (Boy Scout 
Grounds); 10 a.m., Parade (Down-
town Muleshoe); 10:30 a.m., Mule-
shoe Pioneers Celebration; 12 noon, 
Bar-B-Que catered by the Odessa 
Chuck Wagon Gang; 

12:30 p.m., Fiddling contest; 1 
p.m., Mule rodeo; 5 p.m., Sky 
Divers exhibition; 6 p.m., Mule 
races; 7 p.m., Miniature golf tour-
ney (miniature golf course west of 
city); 7:30 p.m., Party, supper 
served by Muleshoe Volunteer Fire 
Dept.; and 8:30 p.m., Dance, live 
band to perform. 

Throughout the morning, enter-
tainment will be provided by Flat-
land Blue Grass Band and that 

For any further information con-
cerning the Mule Day Festival, 
contact Jeff Smith at 806-272-5545 or 
806-965-2886. 

Work is rapidly progressing on the 
Farwell Community Center, with 
the outside of the building virtually 
completed, and the inside rooms 
also nearing completion. The first 
picture shows the front entrance 
featuring two access ramps and 
four doors. The other picture is 
taken looking into the building from 
immediately inside the front door-
way. In the background, the mov- 
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First BTD 

square dance 
• 

-A big success 	• 

• 

Funeral rites held 

With 86 area square dancers per-
forming, the first annual Border 
Town Days Square Dance was 
termed a "big success" by or-
ganizers of the event. 

The dance held Thursday night, 
July 26, at Farwell Community 
Center kicked off the weekend's 
BTD festivities, and was sponsored 
by the Muleshoe Squares dance 
club. 

Some 25 spectators also enjoyed 
the big evening, and they and the 
dancers reported such a good time 
that the event will become an 
annual affair for the BTD celebra-
tion, says Fred Chandler, one of the 
members. for Rev. A. W. Harris 

In appreciation 
TRIBUNE DEADLINES Members = of the 

Rotary Club and 
hosted an ice cream News and Photos 

Texico-Farwell 
their families 
and cake social 

last Thursday afternoon at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Christian in 
Texico. Ralph Gates, club vice- 

president, presented Bill with his 
past president's pin for serving as 
Club President last year. 

5 p.m. Tuesday 
••• 

100 prospective jurors called News of Tuesday 
night events 

9 a.m. Wednesday 
41•11,  

Display Ad Copy 
5 p.m. Tuesday 

Classified Ad Copy 
Wednesday Noon 

Doyle Ford, Anona Pavalus, Ella 
Ruth Williams, Connie Julian 
Barnes, Mrs. Fidencio Guzman, Lee 
Dennis Jesko, Mrs. Mike Rieth-
mayer, Roberta Johnson, Stephanie 
Foster. 4,  4/ 4. ••••.- 

Funeral services for Rev. A.W. 
Harris, 87, of Texico were conduct-
ed Monday, Aug. 6, at the First 
Assembly of God Church in Clovis. 
Officiating were Rev. Ray Allen, 
assisted by Rev. Curtis Wood, Rev. 
Paul Savage, and Rev. David Sasse. 

Burial was in the Texico Ceme-
tery, under the direction of Steed-
Todd Funeral Home. 

Rev. Harris died Friday, Aug. 3, 
at Clovis High Plains Hospital. He 
was born August 16, 1896, in Baxter 
County, Arkansas. 

As a child, he lived with his 
parents in Indian Territory (Okla.) 
and then in Seymour, Tex. As a 
young man he pastored in LaMesa. 
He married Clara Mae Greathouse 
in 1927, and moved to Littlefield, 
where they established a new 
church. 

He came to Texico in 1946 where 
he founded the Texico Assembly of • 

God Church, and pastored there for 
seven years. He returned in 1971 to 
live and pastor at the Texico 
church. 

Survivors include his wife, Clara 
Mae, of the home in Texico; a 
daughter, Mrs. Frankie Arnold of 
Clovis; three sons, Kennard of 
Hurst, Darrel of Plano, and Rex of 
Mountainaire, N.M. 

Also surviving are nine grand-
children, five great-grandchildren; 
one sister, Mrs. Tommie Cox of Las 
Cruces. He was preceded in death 
by a daughter, Marion Cohorn in 
1981. 

Casketbearers were John Moore, 
Lawson Canipe, Wayne Wolfe, 
Richard Morris, Michael Morris 
and Gorman Hand. 

Honorary bearers were Dr. Harry 
Loree, Dr. Stephen Haynes, Dr. 
Alan Haynes, Sr., Asa Smith, Dex-
ter Todd, and Ray Tharp. 

Services conducted 

for Clara Rickert 

dr 

Oriental Stucco $10.45 

Masonry Cement 41.25 

Portland Cement 4.95 

Storm Windows 10.00 & Up 

Insulation - Fiberglass 4.20 Per Sq. ft. 

Funeral services for Clara A. 
Rickert, 86, of Muleshoe were con-
ducted Monday afternoon, Aug. 6, at 
Ellis Funeral Home Chapel of the 
Chimes, under the direction of Ellis 
Funeral Home in Muleshoe. Mrs. 
Rickert had been a resident of Far-
well Convalescent Center. 

Another service was held on Wed-
nesday, Aug. 8, at Ebenezer Evan-
gelical Congregational Church in 
East Greenville, Pa., with Rev. Phil 
Walck; church•pastor, officiating. 

Burial was in Schoenersville 
Cemetery in Lehigh County, Pa. 

Mrs. Rickert died August 3, 1984, 
at West Plains Medical Center in 

Thompson, Katherine Beard, Janie 
Bradshaw, Robert Kregg Wilson, 
Nancy Jackson, Larry Edward 
Hicks, Victoria Abeyta, Richard 
Joseph Tullis, Doyce Ray Waddell, 
Fred Martin Burch, Matilda Baca, 
Raymond Rocha, Jr.; 

And, Barbara Simpson, Joe S. 
Talley, Mrs. Billy Meeks, Edna 
Miller, Lori Elise Richards, Mark 
Randall Foster, Lucy Hinkle, Mary 
Foster, Artis Eaves Light, Lynn 
Mahaney, Myrtle Anthony, Melissa 
Fae Pruett, Marion Hugh Carson; 

Also, Dorothy Harris, Don Geries, 
E.L. Rodriquez, Donna Williams, 
Johnny Wesley Hand, Everett 
Joseph McBroom, Barbara Lowe, 
Betty Jean Castleberry, James 
Lynn Brown, Max Bush, Diana 
Carol Clark, Jerry Lynn Shelton; 

And, David Merlin George, Gloria 
Mahaney, D.C. Herring, Dennis 
Lynn Smith, James Ausburne Lof-
tin, Carliss Woods, Lonnie McFar-
land, J.T. Hammonds, Catherine 
Leona Koelzer, Juanelle Jordan, 
Sandra Jean Zamora, Donald Ray 
Verner; 

Also, Larry Eugene Anthony, Sel-
so Maldonado, Alan McCleskey, 

Free Delivery To 
Texico 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

Muleshoe. She was born May 16, 
1898, in Catasauqua, Pa. She mar-
ried A. Raymond Rickert August 16, 
1927, in Catasauqua. He preceded 
her in death in 1974. 

She had lived in the Muleshoe-
Farwell area since 1979, moving 
from East Greenville, Pa. 

Mrs. Rickert was a music teach-
er, retiring from the East Green-
ville public school system. She was 
a member of the Ebenezer Evan-
gelical Congregational Church. 

She is survived by a son, Dale 
Rickert of Clovis, and one grand-
child. 

1201 E. First Clovis 	763-4437 

	1 Fire calls 
Both the Farwell and Texico 

volunteer fire departments were 
busy the past week making several 
ambulance runs and transporting 
patients to area hospitals. 

On August 3 at 8:49 a.m., the Far-
well ambulance was called to assist 
Texico firemen at Target Fuel in 
Texico, scene of a two-car accident, 
but the Farwell ambulance was not 
needed for transportation. 

On August 5 at 3:46 p.m., the 
Farwell ambulance was called to 
Farwell Convalescent Center where 
it transported a patient to the 
Friona hospital. 

On August 5 at 4:21 p.m., the Far-
well ambulance was called to an 
Avenue B residence where it trans-
ported a patient to the Friona hos-
pital. 

One hundred prospective petit 
jurors have been called to report to 
the Parmer County District Court-
room on Tuesday, Aug. 14, at 10 
a.m. 

Eleven cases are on the docket in 
the 287th Judicial District Court to 
be presided over by Judge Jack D. 
Young. 

Cases to be heard are as follows: 
Antonio Rios, Sonny Reyna, and 

Andres Ortiz, burglary; Kenneth 
Ray White and Sandra Kowalchuk, 
theft, two cases; Gilbert Ortiz, Jr., 
burglary; Johnny Zapata, burglary 
of a habitation; Socorro Sauceda, 
unauthorized use of a motor vehi-
cle; 

Also, Noble Glover, burglary of a 
habitation; Armando Ortiz, unau-
thorized use of a motor vehicle; 
Edward Padilla Diaz, Guadlupe 
Lopez, and Henry Silva, aggravated 
assault; Rafael Castaneda, bur-
glary of a habitation; and Valente 
Bazaldua, felony theft. 

The following persons have been 
mailed a summons: 

Connie Bachman, Elvie Tipton 
Jennings, Eva Miller, Olive Massie, 
Katharyn Eddins, James Berry, 
Lora Dale, Janis Salyer, Susan 
Franse, Peggy Snider, Baltazar 
Martinez, Homor 0. Lindeman; 

Also, Steven K. Kaltwasser, C.B. 
Looper, Noonan Casey White, Jr., 
Dorothy Roach, Joe A. Walters, 
Archie Earl Echols, Bettye Dollar, 
Huston Leroy Hoover, Eddie Morri-
son Mays, Ida Lisa Escobedo, Mar-
garet Huff, Sandra Gregory, Joyce 
Gauntt; 

And, Danny E. Carthel, Jimmy 
Dale Bishop, Norma Joy Barlow, 
Larry Kim Parr, Kipi Lee Fleming, 
Gretta Warren, Lena Thompson, 
Joe Gonzales, Hugh Moseley, 
James Steven Williams, Sallie 
Robinson, James Robert Taylor, 
Leon Ware; 

Also, Winette Parr, John S. 

On. August 3 at 7:45 a.m., the 
Texico ambulance was called to the 
scene of a two-car accident at Tar-
get Fuel in Texico, where they 
transported one person to the Mule-
shoe hospital. 

On August 5 at 4:45 p.m., the 
Texico ambulance was called to 
Farwell Convalescent Center to 
assist in transporting another resi-
dent to the Friona hospital. 
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COMBEST 
COMMENTS 
By Larry Combest 

Working for Fair and Effective Farm Policy 

The Pacheco family of Clovis, New Mexico: Paul, Mary Ann, Kelly, Sonya and Raul, with their Ford Crown I 
Victoria station wagon. 

What impresses Paul is "the comfort, the smooth 
ride, and the way it's styled:' 
And, one more thing: his Ford Dealer. "He went 
out of his way to help us. He treated me right:' 

t..90;:t FORD 

"We traded in our Chevrolet for this Ford Crown 
Victoria station wagon:' says Paul Pacheco. 

And that decision delighted his wife, Mary Ann. 
"When Paul showed me the Crown Victoria, I was 
really pleased. I had a Ford wagon myself . . . 
a Ford Fairmont, so I've always been pleased 
with Fords. 

"It was the smooth ride of the Crown Victoria that 
sold me. When I'm in it. I feel I'm in a big luxury 
car. It's so graceful:' 

Last month I was invited to 
Dallas to join a group of farm 
representatives in a meeting 
with Agriculture Secretary John 
Block. Secretary Block's stated 
purpose in calling the meeting 
was to hear our recommenda-
tions on rewriting farm policy 
for 1985. 

Tommy Fondren, represent-
ing the Texas Association of 
Cotton Producer Organizations, 
spoke about federal laws that 
increase our costs of production, 
laws that foreign producers do 
not have to contend with, and 
that hinder our ability to com-
pete in the world market. 

S. M. True of Plainview, pres-
ident of the Texas Farm Bureau, 
told how important exports are 
to the future of America's 
farmers. 

And I presented six proposals 
to help make future agricultural 
policy more fair and effective 

See Your Class A Southwest Ford Dealer 

every representative there was 
that agricultural policy should 
be fair to all farmers. West 
Texas farmers don't need the 
government's help to understand 
that "everyone can't always get 
everything he wants." We don't 
want or expect anything more 
than we deserve from Washing-
ton—an effective agricultural 
policy that realizes farmers must 
make a profit, a policy that gives 
all farmers a fair shake on gov-
ernment programs. 

In my closing statement I in-
vited Secretary Block to conduct 
a similar hearing in the South 
Plains area. I did this to give 
him the opportunity to hear 
from the many outstanding 
farmers who could not attend 
the Dallas meeting and to let 
him know we intend to make 
sure he keeps the promise he 
made to us that day: "In the 
end, we will all get together and 
write the farm legislation." 

Larry Combest is a fourth 
generation West Texan raised on 
a West Texas farm. He served 
as area President of the F.F.A. 
and received the Sante Fe Award 
at the National F.F.A. Conven-
tion in 1963. He served as leg-
islative aide for agricultural pol-
icy for Senator John Tower and 
is a candidate for U.S. Repre-
sentative. 19th District. 

Friona Motors 
Grand & Highway 60 P. O. Box 957 Friona, Tx: 

for the people of the 19th dis-
trict. 

In some ways I was encour-
aged by the meeting in Dallas. 
This was the fifth regional meet-
ing and others are planned be-
fore the policy is written next 
November. 

These "listening sessions," as 
Block calls them, are a step in 
the right direction for the ad-
ministration. Listening to farm-
ers is essential to building a 
foundation for good farm policy. 

But there was something the 
secretary said at the meeting 
that concerned me as I'm sure it 
did many others there. Block 
said the meeting should "help 
us understand why everyone 
can't always have everything he 
wants." This made me Wonder 
if he'd fully understood the 
needs we presented. 

The common thread that ran 
through the statements of almost Paid For by Combest Congressional 

Committee 
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Horse 

sense 

This three-month-old filly belonging 
to Ed Hardage of Texico proves by 
these photos that horses aren't 
dumb. The Leo-bred filly got 
tangled under a fence when she was 
only a month old and her left back 
leg was broken. She does hobble 

was afraid she would be done away 
with. He doesn't know if she will 
make it, but he does know that she 
has a will to live and endure the 
pain, and she shows a whole lot of 
"horse sense." 

around on three legs, but she can't 
lie down, so she rests that leg by 
leaning back on the fence rail. This 
is the way she sleeps only leaning 
back even more with her front legs 
up off of the ground. Hardage didn't 
take her to the veterinarian as he 

p 

"The first thing we want to do this 
year is drum up membership and 
get things rolling again," said Eddie 
Smith, president of Farwell Booster 
club. 

The Farwell Boosters met for 
their first meeting of the 1984-85 
school year Tuesday night with dis-
cussion focusing mainly on plans for 
the year, among which is to 
encourage more members to join 
the club. 

Members also discussed having 
pictures of the athletes made to be 

I, displayed in local businesses, as 
was done last year, and also con-
sidered purchasing Steer caps for 
resale similar to those sold last 
year. 
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members listed above. 
Entry fee for this tournament is 

one can of Wilson or Penn tennis 
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and all tennis players from the area 
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Farwell school board 

okays repair of roofs 
allow change in the in-service days, 
approved the in-service plan as pre-
sented, and approved the Student 
Handbook as presented. 

Athletic Director Monte Barnes 
gave a report on repair of the tennis 
courts. 

In final action, the Board agreed 
to place eight teachers at Level 2 on 
the Career Ladder, and accepted 
the financial reports, and approved 
the payment of bills. 

Board members present were Joe 
Hughes, Wilbert Kalbas, Maxine 
Williams, Floyd Coates, Steve Pier-
son, Richard Haseloff, and Edward 
Corn. 

Also in attendance were Superin-
tendent W.M. Roberts, principals 
Lynn Burton, Jerry Owen and 
James Craig; and Monte Barnes. 

Farwell School Board, meeting in 
regular session Monday night, 
agreed that hail damage to the 
school building roofs created an 
emergency situation and okayed the 
roof repair. 

The Board accepted the bid of 
West Side Sheet Metal in the amount 
of approximately $27,104 to repair 
the hail damage to the roofs. 

Also approved was the hiring of 
De'Aun Willoughby to do the school 
audit for 1983-84, and members 
adopted Policy Manual changes 
needed to implement Senate Bill 246 
and House Bill 72. Members ap-
proved the plan for the implementa-
tion of Senate Bill 246. 

In other action, the Board agreed 
to change the school calendar to 

• 

• 
Farwell Booster Club 

plans membership drive 
Entries needed for two Clovis tennis tourneys 

These and other plans for the up-
coming year will be discussed again 
at the next meeting of the club on 
Tuesday, Aug. 14, at 8 p.m. at the 
Farwell school cafeteria. 

Officers of the club are Eddie 
Smith, president; Randy Kelley, 
vice-president; and Cynthia Thig-
pen, secretary. 

Smith encourages anyone in the 
community to become a member of 
the Farwell Booster Club and sup-
port the athletic programs at Far-
well schools. 

For more information or for club 
membership, call Eddie Smith at 
481-3695 or Cynthia Thigpen at 
481-9355. 

Receives 

promotion 

The first annual Junior Open Ten-
nis Tournament will be held at Clo-
vis High School tennis courts August 
15-17. The tournament is open to all 
tennis players, 7-18 years of age. 

Entry fee for each event is $2.00 
plus one can of either Wilson or 
Penn tennis balls. Tournament di-
rectors taking entries before the 
August 14, 5 p.m. MDT deadline are 
Joann Dudley 762-7674, Peggy Mc-
Neil 763-4186, or Judy Russell 762-
3934. 

Age brackets of competition are 
7-10, 11-13, 14-16, and 17-18. Events 
are singles, doubles, and open mix-
ed doubles (any age combination). 

Awards will be given for first and 
second places in each event. 

On August 18 and 19, the 9th 
annual Avis Challenge Cup tourna-
ment will be held, also at the Clovis 
courts, starting at 8 a.m. MDT. 
Entries are now being taken by the 
same Clovis Tennis Association 

Charles Roberts, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. W.M. Roberts of Farwell, has 
been named assistant principal at 
Fort Stockton High School. He had 
been assistant principal in the jun-
ior high school in Fort Stockton for 
approximately five years. He is 
married to the former Susan Blair 
and they have two children, Mat-
thew, age 8, and Amy, age 2. 

0000-000000000 
STOP! 

Thanks! You have just 
proven the pulling power of a 
small Tribune ad. 

OCX>0004000-0000  

Sheriff's report 
bond was set at $3,000. His case is 
pending grand jury action. 

Alberto Ramirez, 17, of Friona 
was arrested on August 6 by Friona 
police officers on a charge of pos-
sessing an illegal weapon. His bond 
was set at $500, and his case is 
pending in county court. 

a. 
On August 4, Victor Huizar of 

Bovina reported that his 1976 Ford 
pickup was stolen sometime Friday 
night. The pickup was parked at his 
residence in Bovina. Estimated 
value was listed at $3,000. 

FILLED WITH YOUR 
FAVORITE SOFT DRINK 

According to the report from the 

S
office of Parmer County Sheriff Bill 
Morgan, three arrests were made 
during the past week by area law 
officers, and one theft was reported. 

Manuel Hernandez, 43, of Bovina 
was arrested on July 31 by sheriff's 
officers on a charge of assault. He 
made $300 bond, and his case is 
pending in county court. 

Pedro Lopez Espitia, 29, of Friona 
was arrested on August 3 by Friona 
police officers on a charge of bur-
glary. He appeared before Justice 
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1 CARING MAKES GOOD 
NEIGHBORS 

SUPPORT THE MUSCULAR DYSTROPHY 
ASSOCIATION KIDS DOORBELL BRIGADE AUG 25th & 26th, 

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
AUG. 9-11, 1984 ALLSUP 

CONVENIENCE STORES 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 

OPEN 24 HOURS-EVERYDAY 
ICE-SELF SERVE GAS-GROCERIES 

MONEY ORDERS- 
FRESH COOKED FOODS 

FOR SUMMER DRIVING: CHECK YOUR TIRES, OIL, BATTERY AND FILTER. 

Helton Oil, Inc. 
Serving The Texico-Farwell Area 

Ph. 481-3222 THERE'S ONE NEAR YOU 



To be given away Honored at coffee 

Science training 

Your 
COACHMEN® 

RV Center 

CLOSE OUT 
On All 1984 Models 
Now Is The Time To 

SAVE 
On Your RV Purchase! 

Plains Equipment 
& RV Center 

5400 Mabry Drive - Clovis, NM 

Receives diploma 

New Basic Cable Channels 

MTV (Music Television] MTV 
brings today's music hits alive. See 
rock'n roll hitmakers performing 
their newest music in specially 
produced video-albums. There's 
also weekend concerts, rock 
movies, music-biz news and 
exclusive interviews. 

111

17600 Main - Clovis - Ph. 763-4411 

M c Caw 
Cabltuision 

MUSIC TELEVISION" 

Come And See 

MIKE HASELOFF 

For The Best Deals 

On Cars & Trucks 

Infants and 
Maternity 

Wear 
1312 Main 763-7145 

CLOVIS 
SHOPPING 
DIRECTORY 

3 100 La 
1Z,9aTrilidWELL BODY SHOP 

Clovis, N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 For Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM — - 
LARGE SELECTION 

PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

O.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

617 Main 

HUDSON UPHOLSTERY 
Custom Upholstery. Slip Covers, Bedspreads 

.And Decorator Specialty Items 

• Ph. 505/1t3-4132 1325 S. Prince St. 
Clovis, New Mexico 
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Edith Brewer hosts 

Miller family reunion 

The family of Mrs. Bert Miller, 
mother of Edith Brewer and Mau-
rine May of Clovis, spent weekend 
before last in Clovis. 

Mrs. Miller celebrated her 90th 
birthday earlier this year, but on 
Sunday, July 29, enjoyed having all 
six of her children and some grand-
children present to visit, make pic-
tures, and have dinner together at 
the home of Edith Brewer. 

Rose and Eddie Strong of Deming, 
N.M., and Edith Brewer and Mau-
rine May of Clovis. 

Grandchildren and great-children 
present were Michael and Beverly 
Miller and daughter Traci of Can-
yon, Rickey and Cheryl Miller of 
Dallas, Melody and Dusty Dillon of 
Canyon, Mylina Helm of San Diego, 
Calif., Richard and Patty May and 
children Kelly and Kris of Clovis, 
Roselyn Patterson, son David and 
Cindy and their son Kevin of Clovis, 
and Lonnie and Rena Haney and 
daughter Celeste of Wichita Falls. 

Also here for the reunion was Mrs. 
Della Miller of Memphis, Tex., 
sister of Mrs. Miller. 

Those present were her three sons 
and three daughters and families, 
Clyde and Henrietta Miller of Can-
yon, James 0. and Dorothy Miller of 
Memphis, Tex., Rudolph and Mary 
Jo Miller of Wichita Falls, Velma 

Members of the Farwell school Flag 
Corps will award this handmade lap 
quilt to some lucky winner next 
week. Displaying the quilt are, from 
left, Sherry Ledbetter, Marla 
Meeks, Shelly Landrum, and Mi-
chele Stover. The Flag Corps group 

Farwell science teacher 

completes summer course 
is accepting donations of $1 each on 
the quilt, with the proceeds to be 
used to purchase special shoes for 
their performance this year. Any-
one wishing a ticket is asked to call 
481-3450. The winner will be an-
nounced in next week's paper. 

Clara Lou Nanninga of Albuquer-
que, wife of District Governor Si 
Nanninga of Rotary International, 
was honored at a morning coffee 
last week in the home of Sharron 
Hughes, right, wife of Rotarian 
Walter Hughes. Other Rotarian 

wives visiting and enjoying refresh-
ments of coffee cake, assorted fresh 
fruits, juice and coffee were Mina 
Sheets, Frances Boling, Rachel 
Ware, Deanna Gates, and Margaret 
Aycock. 

Eva Dean Stephens, science 
teacher at Farwell junior high and 
high school, recently completed a 
three-week Summer Science Train-
ing Program at Eastern New Mexi-
co University. 

The course was open to juniors 
and seniors in high school and two 
teachers. The program is nationally 
funded, and the Science Academy 

• 
furnishes tuition and room and 
• board. 

All areas of science, including 
biology and chemistry, were offered 
in the training, and students took a 
field trip in geology to Carlsbad 
Caverns. 

Mrs. Stephens said the course was 
one of the most enjoyable and 
informative that she has ever taken. 

Laz. Homemakers 

tour Tolk Plant 
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shaw and daughters, Connie, 
Teresa, and Lynette from Roswell. 

Also visiting in the Perry home 
were Mr. and Mrs. Welch Morgan, 
longtime friends of the Perrys. 

* * * 

Visiting in the home of Rev. and 
Mrs. Steve Stephens of Farwell 
recently were his mother, Mrs. 
Charlie Stephens, and his sister and 
family, Dara and Richard Rhodes 
and children Allison and Jon, all 
from Abilene. 

Weekend visitors were friends 
from Grants, N.M., Mr. and MN. 
Chuck Russell. 

Correction 

Lazbuddie Young Homemakers 
met on Monday, July 30, for a 
special summer meeting. They took 
a guided tour of the Tolk Plant. The 
Texas Young Homemaker organiza-
tion has added "energy conserva-
tion and natural resources" to the 
list of awareness objectives for local 
Young Homemaker chapters. 

In keeping with that objective, the 
Lazbuddie chapter has made an 
effort to learn more about energy 
production and conservation in this 
area and has promoted energy 
conservation awareness in the Laz-
buddie School by giving ribbons for 
conservation posters in the elemen-
tary grades. 

After an interesting tour of the 
Tolk Plant, club members went to 
the Pizza Hut for lunch and a 
summer business meeting. Presi-
dent Lana Copp called the meeting 

to order. 
Plans were made for attendance 

at the Area I meeting in Plainview 
on August 25. 

Also discussed were several new 
projects for the coming year. Mem-
bers are getting ready to start 
selling pecans and the last of their 
cookbooks. 

A special topic of discussion at 
this meeting was how they could 
best use the money to be donated to 
the Lazbuddie School for play-
ground equipment. Members voted 
to provide supplies and refresh-
ments for a community playground 
workday on Saturday, Aug. 18. 

Those attending were Janice 
Bradshaw, Marca Morris, Debbie 
Weir, Cindy Cargile, Reta Mimms, 
Debbie Magby, Lana Copp, Vickie 
Burch, and advisor, Cassandra Car-
gile. 

Shown using a transmission elec-
tron microscope is Eva Dean Ste-
phens, science teacher at Farwell 
junior high and high school. Mrs. 
Stephens recently completed a 

`Jubilee of Arts' set 

Aug. 10-11 in Hereford 
three-week Summer Science Train-
ing Program at ENMU. The train-
ing course was in all areas of 
science including biology, chemis-
try, and geology. 

Aileen Teel of Texico spent the 
weekend in Longworth, Tex., visit-
ing with her sister and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Hanna, and her 
mother, Dovie Brunson, who makes 
her home with the Hannas. 

4.*4 
Gracie Dane of Texico went to 

Roswell on Sunday, July 29, to visit 
in the home of her daughter and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Ira Winkler. 
She also got to visit with her grand-
daughter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Huckabee and two children of 
Pine Hill, Ala., who were also there 
for a visit. 

Vera Hudson of Clovis accom-
panied Mrs. Dane to Roswell. 

*** 
Visiting in the home of Linnie Mae 

Crook and daughter Jacquetta in 
Farwell over the weekend were two 
other daughters, Gari Lynn Worley 
of Point Pleasant, W. Va., and 
Euritha Marie Jones of Dallas, and 
a son, Darrell Crook of Dallas. 

Other visitors were a sister-in-
law, Vera Shuck and family from 
Oklahoma City, Okla., and a sister-
in-law and brother-in-law, Nellie 
and French Crook of Bovina. 

While here, the visitors cele-
brated the 82nd birthday of Vera 
Shuck. 

*** 
Rev. and Mrs. W.T. Perry of 

Farwell enjoyed a surprise visit 
over the weekend of their daughter 
and granddaughters, Carol Cren- 

Winner of the traveling plaque for 
having the most percentage of 
living members of their Farwell 
high school graduating class pres-
ent Saturday afternoon during the 
Border Town Days celebration was 
the class of 1954, and not the 1944 
class as reported. 

After a check of the graduates 
present for each class, the 1954 class 
had 13 graduates registered of the 15 
living graduates in the class, for 86.6 
percent. 

The class of 1934 had 10 of its 12 
living graduates present for 83.3 
percent, and the class of 1944 had 13 
of 17 living graduates present for 
76.4 percent. 

Country club ladies 

host annual tourney 

Hereford is the place to be to see 
the "Jubilee of Arts," a display of 
talents from several parts of Texas, 
says Jolene Bledsoe, director of the 
show. 

Enjoy this event in the air condi-
tioned Community Center, just 
across the street from Dameron 
Park, open from 10 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
both Friday and Saturday, Aug. 10 
and 11. No admission will be 
charged. 

A large variety of booths featur- 

ing outstanding work from many 
artists in all fields will be on dis-
play. 

Among the many artists showing 
their crafts will be Janie Bowery of 
Farwell and Ginnie Seifert and Mrs. 
Tom Grady, both of Clovis. 

Other events in the Community 
Center during the two-day Town and 
Country Jubilee will be the Senior 
Citizens Quilt Show and the Deco-
rated Cake Show. 

Alice Vinton of Farwell and her 
partner Sabra Srader captured first 
place in the annual Farwell Country 
Club Ladies Association Partner-
ship Tournament held July 26 and 27 
at the country club. 

Flights and winners are as fol-
lows: 

CHAMPIONSHIP FLIGHT: Alice 
Vinton and Sabra Srader, 1st place; 
Penny Hughes and Juanita Jones, 
2nd; with Karen Henderson and 
Cathy Wilson, 3rd. 

FIRST FLIGHT: Janene Berry 
and Claire Brown, 1st; Bettye But-
ler and Gloria Cushenberry, 2nd; 
and Teri Mackonos and Tamie Yeo-
mans, 3rd. 

SECOND FLIGHT: Maxie Scott 
and Marge Gipson, 1st; Jackie 
Vaughn and Julie Smith, 2nd; and 

Sally Miller and Melynn Hunt, 3rd. 
THIRD FLIGHT: Shirley Phillips 

and Doris Bolton, 1st; Robin Gre-
gory and Nancy Orman, 2nd; and 
Linda Erdman and Gayle Stinnett, 
3rd. 

FOURTH FLIGHT: Jo Hamilton 
and Betty McClure, 1st; Anita Fos-
ter and Shirley Hicks, 2nd; and Jody 
Johnson and Jolene Allen, 3rd. 

FIFTH FLIGHT: Ruthie Charles 
and Bernice Norton, 1st; Joyce 
Sikes and Sandy Ware, 2nd; Sue 
Kirkland and Janie Sudderth, 3rd; 
and Darlene Caldwell and Patt Tur-
ner, 4th. 

The Country Club ladies hosted a 
barbecue Thursday night at the 
club, prepared by Walter Hughes 
and his Cook Shack Crew. 

required of all assistant managers 
and includes instruction in opera-
tional procedures, customer rela-
tions, and retail management sys-
tems. The classes were conducted 
at the Allsup's Training Center in 
Clovis. 

After successfully completing All-
sup's Assistant Manager's Training 
Course, Jeannie Simmons, left, re-
ceives her diploma from instructor 
Rick Garris. She returns to the store 
in Farwell to assume the duties of 
assistant manager. The course is 



Clovis High Plains 
Hospital 

welcomes 

Thien T. 
Luu, M.D. 

PEDIATRICIAN 

to the CH PH medical staff 
Temporary Office Location: 

811 Lexington 

Hours: Mon.-Fri. 9 - 12 and 1 - 5 
For appointment call 762-3726 
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Gerald Baileys 

parents of girl 
1944 FHS graduates have 40th reunion 

• 

• 

Gerald and Connie Bailey of Ft. 
Townson, Okla., are parents of their 
first child, a daughter, born Friday, 
Aug. 3, in a Paris, Tex., hospital. 

The new girl has been named 
Brandy Denise, and she weighed 
seven pounds and was 191,42 inches 
long at birth. 

Maternal grandparents are Orie 
and Peggy Jones of Farwell, and 
paternal grandmother is Doris 
Bailey of Clovis. 

Great-grandparents include Mr. 
and Mrs. J.W, Stephens of Clovis. 

of Clovis, Wilbert Kalbas of Far-
well, Jack Knowles of Salinas, 
Calif., Nathan Harding of Odessa, 
Marilyn Anderson Edwards of Far-
well, Peggy Williams Hargrove of 
Farwell, Theda White Taylor of 
Amarillo, and Ruby Ham Meeks of 
Farwell. 

Those classmates unable to at-
tend were Mary Bobst Desgroseil-
lier of Yakima, Wash., Charlene 
Alexander Follis of Clovis, Ruby 
Lee Brand Hendergart of Lode, 
Calif., Ronald Booth of Charlotte, 
N.C., Margaret Bigham Manning of 
Marshall, Mich., and Junior Crume 

of Orlando, Fla, 
Our appreciation to Superinten-

dent W.M. Roberts for providing us 
with names of Farwell students and 
teachers from first through the 12th 
grades. 

The organizers received letters 
from teachers who were unable to 
attend, including 011ie Beck Jarvis 
from Stinnett, second grade teach-
er; Dorothy Shaw McGinnis of 
Temple Hills, Md,, homemaking 
teacher; Mrs. J.T. Carter of Lub-
bock; Lynette Cain McElroy, 
English teacher; and L.S. Pool, 
grade school teacher. 

Wedding 

reminder 

Laura Jacobs of Farwell and 
Roger Wallace of Lubbock will ex-
change wedding vows on Saturday, 
Aug. 11, at 7 p.m. in a back yard 
ceremony at 5713 First Place in 
Lubbock. 

All friends and relatives are in-
vited to the marriage ceremony and 
reception to follow. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rouel Barron of Bovina will be honored with a reception 
in observance of their 50th Wedding Anniversary on Sunday, Aug. 12, 
from 2:30 to 5 p.m. at the Methodist Church in Bovina. 

Everyone is invited to attend the reception which will be hosted by the 
couple's children and grandchildren. 

by LaVelle Hurst Wallbaum 
A memorable occasion was en-

joyed by the Farwell graduating 
classmates of 1944 at a dinner July 
27 in the home of Bert and LaMoin 
Williams, hosted by local class-
mates Lucille Loudermilk, Ruby 
Meeks, Charlene Follis, Peggy Har-
grove, Marilyn Edwards, Bert Wil-
liams, and Wilbert Kalbas. 

Prizes were awarded to Irene 
Burgess Peters, who had been 
married the longest; Bert Williams, 
the most children; and Maxine 
Hughes Smith, the most grandchil-
dren; and LaVelle Hurst Wallbaum, 
who traveled the farthest. 

The class also participated in the 
Border Town Days parade by riding 
on the Farwell fire truck. Since it 
was the first time for most, it was 
certainly a thrill and much fun. 
Afterwards, everyone gathered at 
Farwell City Park for the annual 
barbecue picnic. 

All who attended remarked about 
what a super, great "Homecoming" 
it was. 

Classmates attending were Bert 
Williams of Farwell, Muggins 
Graham of Pampa, Maxine Hughes 
Smith of Lubbock, LaVelle Hurst 
Wallbaum of Yakima, Wash., Irene 
Burgess Peters of Lipan, Tex., Ken-
neth Hughes of Odessa, Juanita 
Billington Meussetti of Hosienda 
Heights, Calif.; 

Also, Lucille Ramm Loudermilk 

Only one marriage license was 
issued from the Parmer County 
Clerk's office since the last report. 

Receiving the license were Ro-
berto H. Munez and Sandra Ann 
Gonzales, 

FHA 1934 grads note 50th year 

S 

Host Carlyle 

family reunion 

second row: Maxine Hughes Smith, 
Peggy Williams Hargrove, Marilyn 
Anderson Edwards, Lucille Ramm 
Loudermilk, Juanita Billington 
Meussetti, and Muggins Graham; 
third row: Kenneth Hughes, Wilbert 
Kalbas, Jack Knowles, Bert Wil-
liams, and Nathan Harding. Not 
pictured is Theda White Taylor. 

Members of the Farwell High 
School graduating class of 1944 
gathered at the home of Bert and 
LaMoin Williams of Farwell on Fri-
day night, July 27, for dinner and 
visiting during their 40-year re-
union. From left, seated, are Irene 
Burgess Peters, LaVelle Hurst 
Wallbaum, and Ruby Ham Meeks; 

S 

by Abie Crume 
The year was 1934. Guy B. Tabor 

was superintendent of Farwell 
school, H.P. Ballengee was princi-
pal, R.B. "Tubby" Taylor was 
coach of the boys basketball team 
which was a hot item. Martina 
Anderson (a grade school teacher 
not much older than the seniors) 
was a popular addition to most 
gatherings, and Dorinda Bond ruled 
the roost in high school English. 

And the graduating class Was 
made up of R.B. "Powder" Floyd, 
Crystal Barker, Jesse Landrum, 
Henry Trent, W.H. (Lovelace) Os- 

Howard and Billie Carlyle, who 
live south of Texico, were hosts for a 
two-day reunion of the Carlyle 
family this past weekend. 

Gathering for Saturday night and 
Sunday were families from El Paso, 
Roswell, Tulia, Dallas, Amarillo, 
Hereford, Muleshoe and Plainview. 

Farwell 1974 class 

has 10-year reunion 

busy at another; Estellene Magness 
Billington, still "doing hair" in Far-
well; Clymena Peters Doose, house-
wife, Clovis; Iona Lovelace Hamil-
ton, Lubbock; and Crystal Barker 
Pitmon, still busy at the girls dorm 
at Levelland Junior College. Unable 
to attend were Buster Crume, re-
tired, California; and W.H. Osborn, 
Clovis. 

The reunion was planned by 
Estellene Billington and Jesse 
Landrum, and following dinner and 
a visiting period on the courthouse 
square with many former friends 
and school mates, the 1934'ers 
gathered at the school home ec 
building. A serving table featuring a 
blue and white "50" cake was 
arranged, and the group spent some 
time getting "now" pictures for 
scrapbooks. 

born, Francelle Pierce, Iona Love-
lace, Hassler Strickland, Estellene 
Magness, Clymena Peters, Estelle 
Hawkins, Freddie Hall, and the 
Crumes, twins Kirt and Kater plus 
older brother Buster. Undoubtedly 
the first and probably the last time 
the school will have three graduates 
from the same fainily at one time. 

On Saturday, July 28, 1984, some 
50 years and quite a few pounds 
heavier, ten surviving members of 
the group got together at the annual 
Border Town Days to catch up on 
current activities and exchange 
memories. 

Present were Kirt Crume, Albu-
querque, retired; Kater Crume, 
Hereford, retired; Jesse Landrum, 
Farwell, retired; Henry Trent, Clo-
vis, retired; Hassler Strickland, 
Lubbock, retired from one job but 

Laz. Homemakers plan 

playground fix-up day 

Winning prizes at the 40th reunion of 
the FHS class of 1944 were, from 
left, LaVelle Wallbaum, traveling 
the farthest; Maxine Smith, most 
grandchildren; Irene Peters, mar-
ried the longest; and Bert Williams, 
most children. Classmates met Fri- 

day, July 27, at the Bert Williams 
home for dinner, and participated in 
the Border Town Days celebration 
Saturday, riding in the parade, and 
enjoying the barbecue meal and 
other festivities in the city park. 

• 

refreshments to the workers. 
A spokesperson for the Young 

Homemakers said, "We know what 
we want to build for the kids, and 
we've raised the money for sup-
plies, but we don't have the muscles 
to put it together." 

Members are asking that anyone 
who is willing to help with this 
worthwhile project to plan on being 
at Lazbuddie School at 9 a.m. on 
Saturday, Aug. 18. 

Lazbuddie Young Homemakers 
are asking for community help in 
their efforts to upgrade Lazbuddie 
School's elementary playground. 

The club is donating money to buy 
supplies for the building of some 
new playground "tire tunnels." 

The Young Homemakers have set 
up a playground "fix-up day" on 
Saturday, Aug. 18. The will have 
supplies on the Lazbuddie School 
playground and will also provide 

Members of the Farwell High 
School class of 1974 gathered July 27 
and 28 in Farwell for their 10-year 
reunion, 

On Friday night, classmate Deb-
bie Sewell and husband J.R. were 
hosts at their home for an informal 
meal of cold cuts, cheeses, and 
chips and dips. 

Attending from Farwell were 
Ricky and Joyce White Ketcherside, 
Brenda Goldsmith Ortiz, Carl and 
Rhonda Kirkland, Micky and Leslie 
Norton Lunsford, Kevin Hargrove, 
Pam Magness Smith, and hosts J.R. 
and Debbie Sewell, 

From Clovis were Grubb and 
Sandra Watkins Howard and Rocky 
and Deb Meeks Richardson. Others 
were Kent and Joyce Armstrong of 
Texico, Norma L. Villareal of Bo-
vina, Lynn Blankenship of Dal-
las, Jamye Craig of Huntsville, 
Larry and Karen Foster Jones of 
Charleston, S.C., Jesse and Sonok 
Cantu of El Paso, Mike and Kathy 
Sullivan Gordzelik of Amarillo, 

11, Gaylon and Pam Sudderth Chap- 
man of Midland, and Frank and 
Bonnie Richardson Roth of Richard- 
son, 

Guests were Charles Wade Norton 
of Artesia, Chad and Joi Meeks 
Banks of Lubbock, Kevin and Cindy 
Watts Eldridge of Amarillo, Tom 
and Lori Norton Hartley of Clovis, 
and Kayle Watts and Lisa Hughes of 
Farwell. 

Pleasant Hills Pals 4-H 

Gathering Saturday night for din-
ner at K-Bob's restaurant in Clovis 
from Farwell were Carl and Rhonda 
Kirkland, Jimmy and Susan Sym-
cox Franse, Micky and Leslie Nor-
ton Lunsford, J.R. and Debbie 
Meeks Sewell, Jim Tabor, Brenda 
Goldsmith Ortiz, Joyce White 
Ketcherside, Curtis and Pam Mag-
ness Smith, Jose and Lucy Jaimie 
Ceneceros, Greg and Sheryl Taylor, 
and Weldon and Sherri Embry. 

Others were Lynn Blankenship of 
Dallas, Lee and Sandra Watkins 
Howard, Gerald and Vickie Coburn 
Williams, and Rocky and Deb 
Meeks Richardson, all of Clovis; 
Norma Villareal of Bovina, Jamye 
Craig of Huntsville, Larry and 
Karen Foster Jones of Charleston, 
S.C., Jace and Jan Ensor of Ruido-
so, Jesse and Sonok Cantu of El 
Paso, Frank and Bonnie Richardson 
Roth of Richardson, and David and 
Cindy Landrum Long of Albuquer-
que. 

Presented awards at the Satur-
day night event were Karen Foster 
Jones, fertility award for five chil-
dren; Kevin Hargrove, baldest; 
Karen Foster Jones, traveled far--
thest; Weldon Embry, changed the 
least; and Jamye Craig, changed 
the most. 

Classmates along with their 
families also met Saturday after-
noon during the Border Town Days 
celebration at Farwell City Park. 

meets with Leah Kelley 

Visit here 

their record books up to date. 
Hostess Leah Kelley served cup-

cakes and Cokes to members Penny 
Pierce, Robin Pierce, Justin 
Barnes, Chad Barnes, Melissa 
Singleterry, Martin Singleterry, La 
Shauna Kelley, Michael Day, Terry 
Whitener, and Brette Southard; 

Also to leaders and visitors Alice 
Pierce, Helen Kelley, Wanda Kel-
ley, Wilma Whitener, Sammy 
Singleterry, Peggy Kelley, and Kent 
Kelley. 

Pleasant Hill Pals 4-H Club met 
Thursday, July 26, in the home of 
Leah Kelley. The meeting was 
called to order by President La 
Shauna Kelley. 

Michael Day led the group in the 
pledge to the American flag, and 
Justin Barnes led the pledge to the 
4-H flag. 

The upcoming Curry County Fair 
was the main topic of discussion. 
Members were reminded to give 
their demonstrations, and have 

A pound of ginger was so 
valuable during the Middle 
Ages that it was worth a 
whole sheep. 

Karen and Larry Jones and chil-
dren from Charleston, S.C., are 
visiting in Farwell with her mother, 
Billie Foster, and in Texico with her 
father, Lewis Foster, and other 
relatives. 

The Jones family arrived July 26 
in time for the 10-year reunion of 
Karen's 1974 Farwell High School 
class, during Border Town Days. 

lb 	They plan a two-week visit. 

hangrisciaa 

• 

S 

Special family Dinners 

Howard's Prime Rib Au Jus 
Seafoods 	Steaks 	Chop Suey 

Butterfly Shrimp 
Howard & Dee Ong, 

OWNERS FOR 26 YEARS 

3120 E. MABRY DRIVE 
CLOVIS, N.M. 

763-4823 

50th anniversary reception 

I/ Marriage license 

1944 class reunion 

Prize winners 

9-1w*A. dtAiacact, tlE4 YOU 
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It 

BACK-TO-SCHOOL 
ABELL-R% 

ER  BARGAINS 

We Specialize in Care 

Free Curls 
ci 

15% OFF PERMS AND HAIR 
COLORS 

Thru August 31 106 W 5th, Clovis 
762-7657 

CHAL*UP 
BACKlibig 
SCHOOL 

CLI  LIU ES! 
Back to school 

clothing in name 
brands you know 

and trust. 
OF CLOVIS, 

520 MAIN 

CLOVIS. NEW MEXICO 88101 

lo de I 1 	a No 
- 	YOUR DEPARTMENT STORE 



Music makers 

CB 
10.000 Wind Turbine 

Distributor for Parmer County 
Steven K. Hillock 

Farwell, Texas Call 825-2240 

"Wind Saves Money" 
"Taxes Go Lower" 

Made for Farmers in Mind 
48-21c 

PORTABLE WELDING 

For your welding needs, call 

HAROLD CHARLSON 

ASME Qualified 	825-3901 
42-tfnc 

Beard contest winners 

Ab 
Sudderth Realty, Inc. 

Drawer 887 - 109 5th St., Farwell, Tx. 79325 

Phone 806/ 481-3288 

Licensed in Texas, New Mexico and Oklahoma 
toWegIrS"sate1/4ASION".0.03 /4"."••••••••••""is irsie r 

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 

Mobile home lots 75' x 150' with all hook-ups in place. Good location. 
• • • 

Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with fenced backyard, within walking 
distance of school. 

• • • 

Must see this elegant 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick home in south Farwell. 
Spacious, isolated master bedroom and bath. Kitchen with skylights, 
dining room, sunken living room and large den, 2 fireplaces, utility 
room, lots of storage. 2 car garage with electric door. Fenced yard. 
Great location. 

Goody handyman special. Stucco, 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with garden 
area. Priced right. 

Nice 3 bedroom, 11/2  bath home with small basement room. Good 
neighborhood, near park. Priced right, $16,500. 

• • • 

Perfect family home, 
carport and garagatfen 	• so 

410,0 

kitchen, lots of storage, 
uit trees. 

Nice brick home in south Farwell, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, small yard with 
block fence, storage building, single car garage. Just right for the 
retired couple. 

INVESTMENT PROPERTY 

Brick Tri-Plex. Each unit 2 bedroom, 1 bath with carport. 100% 
occupancy. Very nice. Possible 91 4% loan assumption. 

FARM AND RANCH 

160 acres, 8-inch w111 
Farwell. 

rea, good farm, southwest of 

• • • 

480 acres, 3 submergible wells, with 405-acre cotton allotment. $51 
government payment per acre. 

• • • 

160 acres, one 8-inch well, good water area, east of Bovina. 
• • • 

160 acres west of Bovina, two wells, one pump. Priced at $290 per acre. 
Owner says sell immediately and will finance. 

160 acres irrigated, two 8-inch wells with Zimmatic sprinkler, south-
east of Farwell. 

••• 

ectric circle sprinklers. 
t of water. Owner says 

'alley area. 

1/4"0"••1/40104.0101WaarNSIONOWasoloWilarosaaa".0%.01/491/40%,..~10Wwitaao% 

We Specialize in Estates 

SAYING IS GREAT 
INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 4.  

- 'Sales and Loans Are Our Service". 

360 acres irrigated, five wells, three circle sprinklers, excellent farm. 
Near House, N.M. 

00* 

Motivated seller says sell immediately. 320 acres with two 8-inch wells, 
good water area, southwest of Bovina. $600 per acre. 

• • 

160 acres with 8-inch e 
of Farwell. 

ircle kler, fenced, southwest 

214 acres. One 8-inch well, one-half mile off highway, Oklahoma Lane ' 
area. 

000 

250 acres. Two 8-inch wells. Near Farwell, near highway. Good farm. 
•.• 

1280 acres with seven 8-inch wells, two circles. Beautiful 3 bedroom, 2 ' 
bath home, nice barn, on highway, good water area, near Lazbuddie. 

• • • 

320 acres irrig 
Approx. 200 feet to 
sell immediate 

in wells, 
nd 
t  
approx. 

far  in  Ple 

Ask the Land Bank 
about... 

money to buy land 
or improve your farm. 

Farmers today are looking at 
ways to increase their productivity 
. .-buying or improving land...build-
ing or remodeling facilities. 

Whatever way you choose to 
grow, the Federal Land Bank can 
provide long-term credit to help. 

So when you're looking to buy 
or build, stop in and talk to the long-
term farm credit specialist at your 
Federal Land Bank Association. 

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 
Bill Liles, Manager 

LENDER 

%Ira" II 
CHARLOTTE PIERCE, 

BROKER 
400 Craig Street 

Texico, NM 
[505] 482-9188 

PIERCE 
REAL ESTATE 

4 8 2- 9188 
T E XICO, 

SOME LOTS still available in the 800 block between State Street and 
Turner Street in north Texico. 

TRAILER PARK with 6 hookups, in Texico. 

BEAUTIFUL BRICK HOME, 2 blocks east of Texico School. 3 bed-
rooms, 2 baths, double garage. Reasonable price. Shown by appoint-
ment only. 

IDEAL home for a single or a couple, 882 sq. ft. plus carport and stor-
age or workshop building of 243 sq. ft., in addition to beautiful yard and 
many extras. Must see this one to appreciate it. Call for appointment. 

ROOM FOR HORSE — Garden, kids. 11/2  acre tract south of Texico City 
Limits. Very nice 3-bedroom double wide mobile home with all the 
extras. Financing available. 

EXCELLENT LOCATION — 1 block east of Texico Schools. 2-bedroom 
home, large living room, separate den with fireplace, attached garage. 
Also on corner lot and has fenced-in backyard. Owner will finance. 

2 BEDROOM HOME —520 Turner, Texico, $14,500.00. Good rental unit. 

3 BEDROOM HOME — 307 Lamar, Texico, $20,000.00. 

FARWELL — 1-bedroom home at 410 First Street. Small house at 
bargain price, $12,000.00. 

FARWELL - eastern edge just outside city limits, very comfortable 
home with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, large living area with fireplace. 
Located on 2-acre tract with livestock facilities. 

FARWELL - 2-story log home on First Street, Farwell, with over 2500 
sq. feet living area. 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, lots of storage space, with 
rental home on back of lot. Owner is ready to sell, with very reasonable 
price! 

FARWELL - 2-bedroom home in very good condition. 969 sq. ft. living 
area, plus carport. Very good location. Immediate possession avail-
able. 
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CLASSIFIEDADs 
OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sports-
wear, Ladies Apparel, Combina-
tion, Accessories, Large Size store. 
National brands: Jordache, Chic, 
Lee, Levi, Vanderbilt, Izod, Esprit, 
Brittania, Calvin Klein, Sergio 
Valente, Evan Picone, Claiborne, 
Members Only, Organically Grown, 
Healthtex, 700 others. $7,900 to 
$24,900, inventory, airfare, training, 
fixtures, grand opening, etc. Can 
open 15 days, Mr. Loughlin (612) 
888-6555. 	 49-1 tp 

NEW SCHAFFER DISK PARTS 

17 New-Used Tractors 
'69 ACG 20' LP. 8 yd Hancock 
scraper. Used tractor and combine 
parts. 2 IHC Trucks 20' bed & hoist. 
843 JD cornhead. 444 JD cornhead. 
'67 C-2 Gleaner LD 20'. 6600 JD gas, 
20'. 

13 Acres Machinery 
BIG NICK MACHINERY 

BOVINA, TEXAS 
238-1614 	 Night 238-1450 

Disc Rolling Service 
Call 505/389-5163 

Tandem, Offset, One Way 
Any Size, Any Style 
On or Off Tractor 

Complete bearing inspection 
and repair. 

39-tfnc 

ROUND-UP 
Application 

30- or 40-inch rows 

Cotton, Milo, Soybeans 

Pipe Wick Mounted 
On High Boy 

Call Roy O'Brian 
806-265-3247 

Friona, Texas 43-tine Caesare Masse, left, fiddler and 
recording artist, entertained the 
huge BTD crowd Saturday after-
noon with a program of music and 
jokes. Masse is a close friend of 
Truman "Smiley" Welch, right, 
well-known local music maker. 
These two along with Ed and 

DIRTY CARPETS? Call Rainbow, 
825-2847 after 5 p.m. Average size 
living room-hallway area $29.95. 
Free estimates. Jerry and Flo 
Davis. 	 48-tfnc 

Juanita Hardage and Fred Chand-
ler, kept the 2,000 attendants at the 
park entertained with toe-tapping 
music and songs all afternoon. 
Chandler was also MC for the after-
noon and kept the events running 
smoothly. 

HUGE GARAGE SALE—Fri. and 
Sat., Aug. 10 and 11, 602 Fourth St., 
Farwell, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. No early 
callers! Baby furniture, baby 
clothes, and lots of miscellaneous. 

49-1 tc 

HOME FOR SALE by owner. 2 bed-
room, newly remodeled, fully car-
peted, fenced in back yard, single 
car garage, 605 - 3rd Street, Far-
well. Call 481-3235 or 481-3270.30-tfnc 

CARD OF THANKS 

The family of Loucile Foster wish 
to thank the choir, Bro. Perry and 
Bro. Stevenson, the Sheriff dept., 
and all our friends for the food, 
flowers, memorials and especially 
the prayers and concern you have 
shown during her illness. 

Bonnie Warren and family 
Bettie Sulser and family 
Robbie Foster and family 
Gus & Becky Umphress and family 

YARD SALE—Thurs., Fri., Sat., 610 
State St., Texico. Small boys 
clothes, books, pots & pans. some 
antiques including solid oak bed-
room suite and glass front china 
cabinet; 10 gal. cream cans, and 
Aladdin lamp. 	 49-1tp ACCEPTING APPLICATIONS for 

employment. Apply in person at 
Farwell Dairy Queen. 	46-tfnc 49-1tp 

Legal notice 
NOTICE TO BIDDERS NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

The Commissioners Court of Par-
mer County will accept bids until 
11:00 a.m. on August 13, 1984 for the 
purchase of a motor grader to be 
used in Precinct #1, to meet the 
following specifications: 

LOST--2 lawn chairs left in Farwell 
park during Border Town Days. 
Someone picked them up to use, but 
didn't return them. My name was on 
them, so whoever borrowed them, 
please return. Kate Phillips, ph. 
825-3283. 	 49-ltc 

FOR RENT—Clean furnished apart-
ment, utilities paid. Inquire at 221 
Anderson Street in Texico. 	49-ltc The Commissioners Court of Par-

mer County will accept bids until 
11:00 a.m. on August 13, 1984 for the 
purchase of a motor grader to be 
used in Precinct #2, to meet the fol-
lowing specifications: 

Winning the title of "Best Looking" 
beard was Craig Chumley, left. 
"Most Unique" beard winner was 
Caesare Masse, center, and having 
the "Ugliest" beard was Roger 
Menning, for the second year hand 

running. Judging the hirsute en-
trants and presenting them with 
plaques were Mona Bryant, Miss 
New Mexico-USA, and Elayne Hor-
ner, newly-crowned BTD Queen, 
right. 

p. 

Legal 

notice 

1-150 S.A.E. net flywheel horse-
power, power shift/direct drive 
transmission, ROPS cab with 
front and rear wipers, 14:00x24 
tubeless tires on 10" rims, 14' 
chrome moldboard with 2' 
chrome extension, no scarifier, 
hydraulic sideshift and tilt, 
35,000 BTU heater, work lights, 
running lights, turn lights, and 
flashers, and cold weather start 
aid, drawbar, vandal protec-
tion, deluxe suspension seat, 
minimum weight 30,000 pounds, 
precleaner, hydraulic hook-up, 
two year warranty. 

1-150 S.A.E. net flywheel horse-
power, power shift/direct drive 
transmission, articulated 
frame, ROPS cab with front and 
rear wipers, 14:00x24 tires on 
10" rims, 14' chrome moldboard 
with 2' chrome extension, scari-
fier, hydraulic sideshift and tilt, 
differential lock-unlock, 35,000 
BTU heater, work lights, run-
ning lights, turn lights, and 
flashers, cold weather discon-
nect and cold weather start aid, 
drawbar, vandal protection, de-
luxe suspension seat, minimum 
weight 30,000 pounds. 

You must take in trade, 1-Cater-
pillar grader. This may be seen by 
contacting Commissioner Ernest 
Anthony at (806) 247-3223. 

Bids should be mailed to the Com-
missioners Court, Box 506, Farwell, 
Tx. 79325 or delivered in person to 
the County Judge Office at the 
Courthouse in Farwell, Tx. prior to 
11:00 a.m. on August 13, 1984 at 
which time bids will be opened. 

The Commissioners Court of Par-
mer County reserves the right to 
accept or reject any or all bids. 

By order of the Commissioners 
Court of Parmer County. 

You must take in trade, 1 Cater-
pillar grader. This may be seen by 
contacting Commissioner Tommy 
Williams at (806) 225-4185. 

Bids should be mailed to the Com-
missioners Court, Box 506, Farwell, 
Tx. 79325; or delivered in person to 
the County Judges Office in the 
Courthouse in Farwell, Tx. prior to 
11:00 a.m. on August 13, 1984 at 
which time bids will be opened. 

The Commissioners Court of Par-
mer County reserves the right to 
accept or reject any or all bids. 

By order of the Commissioners 
Court of Parmer County. 

Published in State Line Tribune 	Published in State Line Tribune 
Aug. 3, 10, 1984. 	 Aug. 3, 10, 1984. SAVE ON IRRIGATION COST! 

* Let us show you how our HIGH 
EFFICIENCY PUMPS can lower your 
energy costs. We offer complete sales & 
service of IRRIGATION PUMPS and 
GEAR HEADS. 
* We also have a CUSTOM Machine 

Shop and Welding Service. 
* Full line of Livestock Feeders 

and Panels. 

TRIPLE S Machine & Pump Co. 
1115 W. 7th St 	Clovis, N.M. 88101 Phone 769-0775 

SATURDAY, AUG. 11 
Penny Anderson Men's Partner-

ship Golf Tournament, Farwell 
Country Club. 
SUNDAY, AUG. 12 

Team meeting for Texico football 
players, 2 p.m. MDT. 
MONDAY, AUG. 13 

Farwell football players begin 
two-a-day workouts, 8 a.m. and 6:30 
p.m. 

Texico football players begin two-
a-day workouts, 8 a.m. and 5 p.m. 
MDT. 

Texico volleyball girls begin 
workouts at 9 a.m. MDT. 

Upcoming sports 

There will be a hearing on Reve-
nue Sharing Funds on August 13, 
1984 at 3:00 p.m. All interested 
citizens of Parmer County are in-
vited to attend. 

Commissioners Court 
Parmer County, Texas 

Published in State Line Tribune 
Aug. 3, 10, 1984. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 



JOHN THOMAS SHONDA FOSTER 

CONNIE GUPTON 

moititroityllk. 
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Wolverine two-a-days Steer football workouts 

to begin Monday to start Monday 
Prospective football players for 

the Farwell Steers will begin two-a-
day workouts on Monday, Aug. 13, 
according to Monte Barnes, athletic 
director and head football coach. 
Sessions will be held at 8 a.m. and 
6:30 p.m. 

Shorts and shoes were issued 
Wednesday of this week, and the 
football hopefuls must return their 
physical slips and parent consent 
slips before they can work out. 

Two pre-season scrimmages have 
been set this month; one with the 
Plains Cowboys on August 24 here, 
and the other with the Dimmitt 
Bobcats at Dimmitt on August 31. 

This will be Coach Barnes' first 

year to lead the Steers. He is opti-
mistic about the upcoming season, 
and he expects to field a strong de-
fensive team. 

"I think, first of all, we have to 
look at being solid on defense; that's 
where most of our experience will 
be, and I feel we will have a good 
defense," said the coach, adding 
that the offense will be determined 
by how well the positions of quarter-
back and center can be executed. 

"Overall, I feel that we will be a 
very competitive team. I can't say 
that we will win district, but I do feel 
that whichever team wins district 
will have to beat Farwell to do it," 
emphasized Coach Barnes. 

field in a scrimmage with Dexter at 
Texico Thursday, Aug. 30, begin-
ning at 6 p.m. MDT. 

Prospective players for the 1984-
85 team are: Seniors: Danny 
Powell, 5'10", 160 pounds, quarter-
back and defensive back; Billy 
Hibbs, 5'8", 150 pounds, tail back 
and linebacker; Ronnie Galvan, 
5'8", 150 pounds, fullback and nose-
guard; Doug Thornton, 6'1", 175 
pounds, tight end and linebacker; 
and Charles Sharbutt 6'1", 185 
pounds, tackle and defensive tackle. 

Juniors: Stanley Cross, 5'8", 155 
pounds, fullback and defensive 
back; Kyle Snipes, 5'7", 140 pounds, 
safety end and defensive back; 
Charlie Bibbs, 5'9", 150 pounds, tail 
back and defensive back; Mark 
Meeks, 6'0", 165 pounds, center and 
defensive end; Jesse Moncayo, 5'7", 
140 pounds, guard and defensive 
tackle; Eric Harding, 6'1", 145 
pounds, tight end and defensive 
end; Lupe Hernandez, 5'9", 205 
pounds, tackle and defensive tack-
le; and John Thomas, 5'7", 140 
pounds, quarterback and defensive 
back. 

Sophomores: Brette Southard, 
5'8", 130 pounds, end and defensive 
tackle; Jubal Pierce, 5'8", 120 
pounds, end and defensive back; 
Jesse Martinez, 5'9", 170 pounds, 
tackle and defensive tackle; Wayne 
Holland, 5'10", 190 pounds, tackle 
and defensive tackle; David Lou-
era, 5'10", 140 pounds, jr. high, and 
Don Vela, 5'9", 140 pounds, transfer. 

Two local students, Shonda Foster of Farwell and John Thomas of 
Texico, participated in Eastern New Mexico University's Upward Bound 
college preparatory program this summer, July 3-14. 

The federally-funded program is designed to generate the skills and 
motivation necessary for success in education beyond high school, 
according to the director of Upward Bound. 

Shonda will be a sophomore this fall at Farwell High School, and John 

Two-a-day workouts for Texico 
Wolverine football hopefuls will get 
underway Monday, Aug. 13, with 

. sessions at 8 a.m. and 5 p.m. MDT. 
"We'll be a small but good team. 

We might have some growing pains 
during the season but when it comes 
time for district, we'll have our say 
as to who makes the play-offs," says 
David Lynn, head football coach for 
the Texico Wolverines, when asked 
about his prospects for the upcom-
ing season. 

The Wolverines are the defending 
Class A State Champions, but will 
have some regrouping to do as the 
team lost nine seniors to gradua-
tion, seven of them starters. 

Coach Lynn says the Wolverines 
.are not in that bad of shape, as 13 
lettermen will be returning. "We 
have lots of kids who played a lot of 
football even though they didn't 
start the games." 

This season should be an interest-
ing season, the coach added, in that 
most opponents expect them not to 
be a good team, with the loss of 
some very good players. The coach-
ing staff headed by Lynn and assist-
ed by Scott Parker and Roy King 
are looking forward to the season. 

"The schedule looks a little rough 
overall," remarked Coach Lynn, 
"with Eunice and Jal expected to 
have a good team, and in district 
play, Tatum and Ft. Sumner are 
always tough." 

The Wolverines will first take the 

will be a junior at Texico High School this fall. 

	  Gupton elected to state board 

Gymnastics Elite group 

August sessions begin 

Connie Gupton of Muleshoe has 
been elected to the board of direc-
tors of the Association of Texas 
Electric Cooperatives. The action 
came during the associations's 44th 
annual meeting July 24-27, in San 

Antonio. 
Gupton is manager of Bailey 

County Electric Cooperative, a posi-
tion he's held since 1977. His career 
with the Cooperative dates back to 
1950 when he joined the staff as 
office manager. 

During his career, he has served 
as past president of the TEC Ac-
counting Association and as presi-
dent of the Rural Telephone and 
Electric Federal Credit Union. He is 
a member of the boards of directors 
of the Kim-Wood and Golden Spread 
Electric Cooperatives, which are 
organizations of rural electric sys-
tems on the High Plains. 

He's a member of the Lions Club, 
past president of the Muleshoe 
Country Club, and past master of 
the Muleshoe Masonic Lodge. 

Gupton and his wife, the former 
Pearl Childress of Muleshoe, are 
parents of a son, David Gupton, who 
is married and resides in Midland, 
and a daughter, Susan (Mrs. Vince) 
Griffin, of Midland, 

0 

August sessions for Gymnastics 
Elite of Farwell are underway with 
the first session August 8-20, and the 
second session set for August 22-31, 
announces Coach Clay Burch. 

"After coming off a very success-
ful season, their hopes are riding 
high," said Coach Burch. "For this 
next season I expect nothing less 
than both the boys and girls teams 
making it to the state champion-
ships, with some individual cham-
pionships and possibly one or two 
all-around champions. 

"Right now we don't have enough 
competitors in each category to go 
for a team state championship. For 
this to occur, the gymnasts need to 
start back into their training as soon 
as possible. 

"We will go ahead and continue 
our new Open Class as I feel this 
class has been a tremendous suc-
cess so far. Purpose of this class is 
to give kids of all ages the oppor-
tunity to work out on the equipment 
at their own level and speed without 
the pressures of competition. 

"It also allows those who want to 
compete later to perfect their basic 

New pediatrician 

opens Clovis office 

tricks and techniques without the 
stressing and pushing team classes 
have to go through to get mentally 
and physically ready for competi-
tion. 

"Gymnastics Elite has more or 
less been closed to the average, or 
young, individual who wanted to 
experience gymnastics without 
competition. This new class now 
gives these kids this opportunity," 
concluded the coach. 

The coach expressed his appre-
ciation to the Farwell School Sys-
tem for its support and backing in 
giving the youth of Farwell the op-
portunities that the sport offers. 

The August schedule is as follows: 
Aug. 8-20 - Open Class, 9 to 10 on 
Mondays and Wednesdays; Boys 
Team, 10 to 11:30 Mondays, Wed-
nesdays and Fridays; Girls team, 
11:30 to 1:00 Mondays, Wednesdays, 
and Fridays. 

Aug. 22-31 - Open Class, 3:45 to 
4:45, Mondays and Wednesdays; 
Boys team, 4:30-6 Mondays and 
Wednesdays, 3:45-5:15 Fridays; 
Girls team, 6-7:30 Mondays and 
Wednesdays, 5:15-7 Fridays. 

resident in pediatrics. 
Dr. Luu is now living in Clovis 

with his wife and four-year-old 
daughter. 

Thien T. Luu, M.D., opened his 
pediatrics practice in Clovis on 

- August 1. His office is located 
• temporarily at 811 Lexington Ave- . 
• nue, until his office at Century 
• Centre (across from Clovis High 

Plains Hospital) is completed. Dr. 
Luu has been appointed as a mem-
ber of the Clovis High Plains Hospi- 

- tal Medical Staff. 
• As a pediatrician, Dr. Luu is a 
specialist trained in the diagnosis 
and treatment of disease in new- 

, borns, infants, children and adoles-
cents. He is also actively involved in 
the counseling in immunization, 

• growth and development, and nutri- 
tion. 

Dr. Luu is from Saigon, and he 
• received his medical degree from 

the Saigon Medical School. After 
serving an internship in pediatrics 
at the Saigon Children's Hospital, 

• Dr. Luu completed a residency at 
Texas Tech Health Sciences Center 

• in Lubbock. There he was a chief 

Classified Ads Get Results 

SMALLWOOD INSURANCE 
AGENCY 

Successors to 
High Plains Insurance 

AUTO HOME • LIABILITY 
Up to 30% deviation on Home Insurance 

policies. Call us to see if you qualify to save. 

Ph. 806/272-4531 	 Muleshoe, Tx. 
S.  

Old Timers Day set tonight 
This musical family comes highly 
recommended, say the sponsors, 
having been to Nashville in June. 

Old Timers Day festivities in Mel-
rose will begin with a pioneer style 
show and musical concert tonight 
(Friday) in the grade school gym 
beginning at 7:30 p.m. MDT. Ad-
mission is $3.00 for adults and $1.00 
for children under 12. 

Authentic fashions as worn in the 
late 1800s and early 1900s will be 
modeled, with adults and children in 
two categories competing for 
prizes. These early years mark the 
beginning of Melrose, a country vil-
lage, established before 1906. 

Older spectators attending will 
have the opportunity to reminisce 
on the fashions and times of yester-
year, and the show promises to be a 
new experience to those of the 
younger generation, says Claudia 
Savage of the style show committee 
of the Melrose Chamber of Com-
merce, sponsor of the event. 

Performing in concert will be 
"The 6 Pounds of Music," with 
country, western, and gospel music. 

THIEN T. LUU, M.D. DON'T KISS $8,938 GOODBYE 
That's how much you could lose 

just on resale value 
if you don't buy a John Deere 

State rep. here Wed. 
State Comptroller Bob Bullock 

announces that Lloyd Allred from 
I  his Lubbock Field Office will be at 

Parmer County Courthouse on Wed-
nesday, Aug. 15, from 2 to 3:30 p.m. 

A comptroller's representative is 
available to assist local residents at 
the courthouse the third Wednesday 
of each month. 

Anyone with problems or ques-
tions concerning state taxes is 

l • urged to contact Allred at the court- 

house in person, or call the Lubbock 
Field Office at 806/795-0691. 

A toll-free number, 1-800-252-5555, 
is also available to Texas taxpay-
ers. 

Looking for a big discount when you buy 	John Deere tractors. And don't forget our 
a tractor? Don't get stuck with an even 	unmatched reputation for high quality 
bigger discount when you want to sell it. 	and high reliability. See your John 

Always consider resale value when 	Deere dealer. He'll be happy to explain 
you price a field tractor. Because the 	the big difference between a low-price 
differences among brands may some- 	tractor and a low-cost John Deere: 
times be bigger than ANY purchase 	100-hp 4050,120-hp 4250,140-hp 
incentive. 	 4450, 165-hp 4650 or 190-hp 4850. 

Compare John Deere with our two 	NOTE: Average resale pnces taken 
leading competitors. According to the 	from Spring 1984 Official Guide of The 
Spring 1984 Official Guide of the National 	National Farm and Power 
Farm and Power Equipment Dealers 	Equipment Dealers Associa- 
Association, the average 5-year-old 	 tion. Percentages 
John Deere 4440 sells for 106 percent = = --= calculated from best 
of its 1979 list price. One leading corn- 	 currently available 

list
averages 87 percent of its 1979 	 information on 1979 

list price. The other averages 73 	 list prices. 
percent. 

What's that mean in dollars? Add 
the John Deere gain on original price to 
the competitor's loss. The John Deere 
advantage is as much as $8,938! 

Is this only true of one model? 	 
No. Every 40 Series 90- to 180-hp 
tractor has an average resale price 
that's higher than its new price five 	 
years ago.  

	

Is resaleyour only John Deere  	
advantage? No. Dont forget 	 . 
the remarkable fuel efficiency 	 M 
of today's 50 Series 

GOTCI1A! 

You've just proven that people 
read small ads. 

frm............................." 
SPECIAL FACTORY PURCHASE: 
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Brothers taking 

westward trek 
From South Padre Island, Tex., to 

Point Barrows, Alaska, is quite a 
distance by any means, but it must 
seem even farther when the only 
mode of transportation is walking. 

Two brothers from Pleasanton, 
Tex., Collin and Matthew Phillips, 
started their quest of walking 
across the western part of the 
United States on June 4. They hope 
to accomplish the cross-country 
expedition in two years and two 
months. 

Having walked 900 miles already, 
from Texas to the Twin Cities, the 
brothers view their walk as a test of 
their mettle. 

Collin, 24, the oldest of the two, 
came up with the idea of the west-
ward venture while searching for 
what he truly wanted to do with his 
life. He had attended school for 
awhile and had tried several jobs 
from an emergency room techni-
cian to a licensed merchant marine 
on a shrimp boat. 

He originally had planned the 
journey to Alaska alone, but when 
he told his brother Matthew of his 
plan, Matthew became interested. 

While attending Angelo State Uni-
versity in San Angelo, Matthew be-
came an exchange student in 
Australia. He enjoyed the exper-
ience of living in the country so 
much, that he plans to go back there 
to live. 

Upon hearing of Collin's plans to 

walk, Matthew decided he did not 
want to go to Australia without ever 
having experienced his own coun-
try, so he asked if he could go along. 
That is when the pair started 
planning their trip, some two years 
ago. ' 

The brothers are taking pictures 
along the way and hope to someday 
write a book about the many stories 
of their travel. So far, everything 
has been learned by trial and error, 
as neither man had any experience 
in cross-country walking before, or 
how to outfit a back pack. 

The pair takes days off to nurse 
their swollen feet, sunburned and 
insect-bitten bodies. The miles they 
travel varies due to weather condi-
tions and impassable private prop-
erty. They are averaging about 24 
miles a day. 

Collin and Matthew intend to stop 
several times before they arrive at 
Point Barrows, Alaska, the north-
ern-most area in North America. 
They must work as they go, in order 
to finance their expedition. The 
amount of money they think they 
will spend is $10,000, considered a 
conservative estimate by both. 

They have had to rely on the kind-
ness of strangers for water and 
sometimes food. They are buying 
most of their food when they can, 
although they plan to hunt and fish 
later in the wilderness. 

Alaska bound 
The Phillips brothers, Matthew, 21, 
left, and Collin, 24, of Pleasanton, 
Tex., stopped at the depot in Texico 
to rest a bit and check over their 
gear. They are attempting a cross-
country trek across the western 

I Around the Twin Cities I 
MONDAY, AUG. 13 

Parmer County Commissioners 
Court, courthouse, 10 a.m. 

**/ 
Texico registration for all grades 

6-8, 8:30 a.m. to 3 p.m. MDT, at the 
high school. 

Farwell City Council, 5:15 p.m., 
city hall. 

Texico Chamber of Commerce, 
6:30 p.m. MDT, Citizens Bank. 

TUESDAY, AUG. 14 
Texico City Council, 6:30 p.m. 

MDT, city hall. 
St* 

Texico School Board, 7 p.m. MDT, 
educational complex. 

*** 
Texico junior and senior registra- 

tion, 8:30 a.m. to 3 p.m. MDT, high 
school. 

WEDNESDAY, AUG. 15 
Texico 9th and 10th grade regis- 

tration, 8:30 a.m. to 3 p.m. MDT, 
high school. 

FARMER AND RANCHER, 
THE WORLD'S MOST 

EFFICIENT IRRIGATION 
SYSTEM, LEAKY PIPET'', 

CAN SOLVE MANY 
PROBLEMS FOR YOU NOW! 

A. Simple and easy to install. You can install 
small areas as time and funds permit and 
add to it as you can. We sell a LP planter 
that fits your three-point tractor or we will 
show you how to build your own. Installs 
150 feet per minute. 

B. All underground 
C. Flexible, porous pipe, sweating under-

ground will irrigate approx. 6,000 sq. ft. 
for every 1,000 ft. of LP buried. 

D. Pasture can be irrigated for less than S.02 
Sq. Ft. (Even a few select acres under 
irrigation would help.) 

E. At least double yield in most orchard and 
nut applications. 

F. The best yard and vegetable garden 
system ever devised. 

G. Some ASCS assistance may be available. 

ENTEK CORPORATION 
Box 879 1 Grapevine. Texas 76051 

Phone: 817/481-5588 

part of the United States, from 
South Padre Island, Tex., to Point 
Barrows, Alaska. The pair stopped 
in the Twin Cities Tuesday of last 
week after walking some 900 miles 
already. Point Barrows, Alaska is 
the northern-most area in North 
America. 
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AT: Capitol Foods 
901 Ave. A 
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Fresh 

BEEF 

Shurfresh 

RIB 

SIRLOIN 
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BOLOGNA 

Sliced 

Choice 

12 

EYE 

LIVER 

Beef 

TIP 

Oz. Pkg. 

Tip 

STEAK 

STEAK" 

Pack 

:.. -;:.: 

FRYERS 

,:t.' 

59' L. 

18-20 Chops 

$1.39 Lb. 

$1.79 th. 

• • . 

1.69 

43.49u). 

69 th.  
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Hormel Super 

PORK 
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CHOPS 
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BATHROOM TISSUE 	89'  Chicken-Of-Sea 	6 1/2 
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Oz. 10i1 or Water Pk.) 

79' ;sTUN?o 
Shurfine 16 Oz. 

PORK-BEANS 	4199 
Heinz 32 

PICKLES 
Oz. Jug Hamburger Sliced 990 

Shurfresh 1 Lb. Quartered 

OLEO 	2189$ 
Shurfresh Grade A Small 

Egos 	2 Doz. 179' 

Shurfine 

POP 
12 Oz. Canned 	 k  

6199 $ 

Shurfine 32 Oz. Jug 

CATSUP 	 79$ 

Kraft 7 1/2 Oz. 

MAC-CHEESE DINNERS 
279t  Galante 16 Oz. Jar Diced 

JAMPONES 
(Packaged in Muleshoe, Tex.) 

4.29 
Big 48 

CRISCO 
Oz. Jug 

OIL $2.59 
Kraft 18 Oz. Jir 

BARBECUE SAUCE 	89' 
Ell 

Hills Bros. 1 Lb. 

COFFEE 42.29 
Hormel 12 Oz. Can 	4'11.11111111w  SPAN ° 4  2a 
SPAM 	OA' 	'IP' 

New 

DIAPERS 
Cabbage Patch Asst. Sizes 

42.99 
Dole 

PINEAPPLE 
46 Oz. Can 

JUICE 99' 

Bama 16 Oz. Jar 

GRAPE JELLY 69 
32 Oz. Jug 

LIQUID 
Palmolive 

DETERGENT "" 
FROZEN FOODS 

Birdseye 12 Oz. Can 

AWAKE 	49' 
Borden's Half Gallon 

ICE CREAM $t 69  
Gary's (5 in.) 

SUPER DOSS 4  siPk9a ... 
GARDEN FRESH PRODUCE 

Calif. 

NECTARINES 39' Lb • 
Golden Ripe 

BANANAS 294  Lb. 1 
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Calif. 1 Lb. Bag 
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