
HOAG AND SONS COOK C I NCERY 
SPR INGPORT MICHIGAN 1192814 

FARWELL, TEXAS FRIDAY, MARCH 21, 1975 10 PAGES 

THE STATE LINE 

TRIBUNE 
"OFFICIAL PUBLICATION OF FARMER COUNTY" 

•••••••Mose 

NUMBER 27 SIXTY-THIRD YEAR 15 CENTS 
,,•„,..,,,,,%., ..nn.n.e.e•"nAo•••""ow'"•.w"...••••••"•",w.e.••oweo••""otok"•,•%""no,"",•."od',"•"••'""e•••"0.'No.'•~‘''e.•'••••••.",,W%"•,,,nm..w.o..n.*.o,..•v.w v.•..",  e.••• 

Funeral Services Held 
For Mrs. Pat Haseloff 

MAN, WOMAN OF YEAR — Saluted as the 1975 Man and Woman of the Year of the Farwell 
Chamber of Commerce were Mayor Gil Patschke and Mrs. Joe (Gwen) Hughes. They were 
presented plaques commemorating this honor by Vernon Scott and Mrs. Carrie Christian, 
respectively, last year's honorees, at the Farwell Chamber of Commerce banquet March 13. 

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Pat Haseloff, 44, were con-
ducted Friday, March 14, at 3 
p.m. CDT from St. John's 
Lutheran Church at Lariat. 
Rev. Herman J. Schelter of St. 
John's Lutheran Church and 
Rev. Norman Gardels of E- 
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PAT HASELOFF 

Weather - - 
`Indian' Crim 
To Read Signs 

"Indian" John Crim has an-
nounced that he will once a-
gain conduct his yearly Indian 
weather forecast for the year 
on March 22. 

The forecast is to be made at 
sunrise on Saturday, March 22, 
as it has been made for more 
than 40 years in Parmer Coun-
ty by Crim. 

The process of reading the 
signs begins with a wood pile 
which is set on fire. As the 
smoke begins to drift from the 
burning wood pile, "Indian" 
Crim reads the smoke signs 
and makes his prediction. Annual Banquet Attracts 

Largest Crowd In Histo 2nd Annual - - 

High school Rodeo 

Planned By Farwell 
Some 240 guests attended the 

annual banquet of the Farwell 
Chamber of Commerce and 
heard Brigadier General Rob-
inson Risner, commander of 
the 832nd Air Division at Can-
non Air Force Base, deliver a 
rousing patriotic address. 

The largest crowd in the his-
tory of Farwell Chamber ban-
quets gathered Thursday, 
March 13, in the Farwell 
schools cafeteria for an eve-
ning devoted to patriotism, the 
announcement of the Man and 
Woman of the Year and the in-
troduction of 1975 directors. 

Serving as master of cere-
monies for the evening was 
Rev. W.T. Perry, e,.:-going 
Chamber president. The invo-
cation was delivered by John 
Getz, and music was provided 
by Mr. and Mrs. Ed Hardage. 
Farwell Mayor Gil Patschke 
introduced the out-of-town 
guests. 

Mayor Patschke presented 
the "Honorary Citizen of the 
Year" award to Mark S. Mc-
Conathy of Amarillo, an urban 
planner with the Panhandle 
Regional Planning Commis-
sion. McConathy was cited for 
helping stimulate plans for a 

manuel Lutheran Church in 
Clovis officiated. Burial fol-
lowed in Sunset Terrace Me-
morial Cemetery in Farwell. 

Mrs. Haseloff died early 
Thursday morning, March 13, 
at Memorial Hospital in Clovis 
following a lengthy illness. She 
resided in the Oklahoma Lane 
community having lived there 
for 26 years, moving from Ver-
non, Tex. 

A native of Chillicothe, Tex., 
Mrs. Haseloff was born on 
Dec. 15, 1930. The former Pat 
Shuman, she married Henry 
Haseloff on April 3, 1949 at 
Vernon, Tex. She was a 
member of St. John's Lutheran 
Church. 

Survivors include her hus-
band, Henry, of the home; 
three sons, Robert of Bovina, 
and Mark and Joe, both of the 
home; her mother, Mrs. Hope 
Shuman of Farwell; and one 
sister, Mrs. Robbie Jean Will-
iams of El Reno, Okla. 

Singleton - Ellis Funeral 
Home of Muleshoe was in 
charge of arrangements. 

schke, and Mrs. Carrie Chris-
tian presented the Woman of 
the Year Award to Mrs. Joe 
(Gwen) Hughes. 

Gil Patschke was born in 
(Continued on Page 2) 

cussed the new nursing home 
proposed by the Farwell De-
velopment Commission, under 
the guidance of president Don 
Williams. 

Culminating an enthusiastic 
outlook was a report that the 
240 assembled guests marked 
the largest banquet ever for 
the Farwell Chamber of Com-
merce. Following his report. 
Rev. Perry was presented with 
a plaque by in-coming Cham-
ber president, Pudge Rose. 

One of the highlights of the 
banquet was the presentation 
of the Chamber of Commerce 
Man and Woman of the Year 
Awards. Vernon Scott present-
ed the award to the Man of the 
Year, Farwell Mayor Gil Pat- 

Texico Chamber Elects 
New Officers, Directors 

city park, a community devel-
opment grant application, an 
emergency medical system 
and a comprehensive city plan 
for 1990. 

Next on the agenda was the 
recognition of outgoing direc-
tors and the introduction of 
1975 directors by Rev. Perry. 
Directors for 1975 include 
Claude (Pudge) Rose Jr., 
president; Johnny Actkinson, 
first vice-president; Gil Pat-
schke, second vice-president; 
and B.J. Roberts, Otis Hug-
gins, Don Williams, Jerry 
Monk, Robert (Toby) Booth, 
John Dempster, Bo Bartley 
and W.T. Perry, who will be an 
ex-officio member. 

In a progress report, Rev. 
Perry stated that Farwell is 
becoming an on-the-go com-
munity with completion of a 
major paving project, passage 
of a school bond issue and one 
of the most successful Border 
Town Days celebrations in re-
cent years in 1974. 

Rev. Perry, continuing with 
his progress report, stated that 
the new Parmer County Law 
Enforcement Center will signal 
a more modernized police set-
up for the area. He also dis- 

New officers of the Texico 
Chamber of Commerce were 
elected from among the direc-
tors at a special called meeting 
on Wednesday, March 12. 

A A D. McDormld will serve as 
the new Chamber president. 

Slates Blood Drive - - , 

Lions Club To Bring 
Circus To Twin Cities 

Bill Thigpen was elected vice-
president, and Louise Engram, 
secretary-treasurer. 

New Chamber directors are 
Lewis Cooper, holdover, and A. 
D. McDonald, Louise Engram, 
Jim Pierce, Bill Thigpen, 
Doyle LaRue and Bill Chris-
tian. They will serve one-year 
terms. 

New officers and directors 
will be installed at the annual 
banquet of the Texico Chamber 
of Commerce set for Saturday, 
April 19. 
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Registration Scheduled 
For Texico Kindergarten 

*Baseball 

Tryouts 

Scheduled 

Two circus performances 
and a blood drive are currently 
in the works, with plans for 
both activities being sponsored 
and coordinated by members 
of the Texico-Farwell Lions 
Club. 

The Franzen Bros. Circus is 
scheduled to present two per-
formances on Thursday, 
March 27, at the Little League 
Ballpark. One performance 
has been scheduled at 6 p.m. 
and the other at 8 p.m. CDT. 

Circus-goers will be treated 
to 90 minutes of exciting fam-
ily entertainment under the big 
top with such acts as trapeze 
artists, high wire, animal acts, 
clowns, etc., anything and 
everything to delight the circus 
fan of any age. 

Tickets may be purchased 
from any Lions Club member 
of from Jim Walker at the 
Citizens Bank of Texico. Ad-
vanced tickets are priced at 
$1.25 for children and $1.75 for 
adults. Tickets at the door will 
cost $1.75 for children and $2.25 
for adults. 

The circus is scheduled to 
arrive and begin setting up at 

.state of Kansas, and the host 
school, Farwell. 

Officers 'of the Farwell Tri-
SptraetseideCnitu;b Kaerne FJancskter  , Foster, 

vice-
president; Lori Norton, secre-
tary; Laura Dosher, treasurer; 
Jacquelyn Langford, reporter; 
and Jerry Mathis and Darrell 
Norton, sponsors. 

Other club members are Lee 
Ann Williams, Rudy Sanchez 
and Jamie Cooper. 

Included among rodeo of-
ficials who are working in 
coordinating and will be work-
ing during the rodeo are 
Donald Christian and Mitz 
Walling, arena directors; Jeral 
James and Buddy Nicholson, 
judges; Hobby Coffman and 
Bobby Chadwick, flag men; 
Pike Jordan and Darrell Nor-
ton, barrier judges; Mack 
Heald and Jerry Owen, time 
keepers; Herb Williams, an-
nouncer; and secretaries, 
Joyce Dosher and Jerry Mat-
his. 

Admission to the rodeo has 
been set at $2.00 for adults, 
$1.00 for students with children 
under six being admitted free. 

*Easter Holidays 

Set At Schools 

During the 1973-74 school 
year, Farwell High School 
Chapter of the Tri-State High 
School Rodeo Association 
(TSHSRA) was formed and the 
first annual Farwell Tri-State 
Rodeo was held. This year 
marks the second anniversary 
of the chapter and the second 
edition of the Tri-State Rodeo 
has been scheduled March 27, 
28 and 29 by the Farwell Rodeo 
Club. 

Activities are scheduled to 
get underway nightly at 8 p.m. 
CDT in the Farwell Rodeo 
Arena with 11 events scheduled 
for cowboys and cowgirls of 
the TSHSRA. 

Included in boys events will 
be bareback riding, bull riding, 
calf roping, bulldogging, rib-
bon roping and team roping. 
Events open to girls include 
barrel racing, break-away rop-
ing, goat tying, pole bending 
and steer riding. Stock for the 
rodeo will be furnished by 
Charlie Thompson. 

In the prize department for 
the rodeo, it has been an-
nounced that first, second and 
third places in each event will 
receive trophy belt buckles. 
Saddles are to be presented to 
the All-Around Boy and All-A-
round Girl of the competition 
with team trophies going to 
both a boys and girls team. 

The rodeo is open to Tri-
State members only and books 
for the annual event will be 
open to all entries postmarked 
by March 19. Entry fee has 
been set at $12.00 per entry per 
event. 

As of presstime 13 schools 
had submitted entries for the 
events including Gruver, Per-
ryton, Amarillo Caprock, New 
Mexico Military Institute, 
Plainview, Happy, Friona, 
Muleshoe, Dumas, Hereford, 
McClain, a school from the 

Tryouts for Pee Wee League 
baseball players only, who are 
eligible to advance to the Little 
League, are to be conducted 
Thursday, April 3, at 5 p.m. 
CDT and Saturday, April 5, at 
10 a.m. CDT. Tryouts will be 
conducted at the Texico-Far-
well Lions Club Ball Park. 

"We are in need of coaches 
for PeeWee and Little League 
teams. We also need mothers 
to help keep scores," states 
Mrs. R. L. May, Texico-Far-
well Little League secretary. 

Adults interested in coaching 
and helping with the score 
books are asked to call Mrs. 
May at 481-3637. 

Jim Rogers, principal of 
Texico Elementary School, this 
week announced that dates 
have been scheduled for re-
gistration for the Texico Muni-
cipal School Kindergarten. 

Registration will begin at 9 
a.m. MDT Monday, April 14. 
Classes will continue through 
May 23. 

Only children who will be in 
the first grade in August, 1975, 
and live in the Texico district 
will be accepted. Parents are 
urged to bring their child's 
birth certificate to registration. 
Children being registered must 
be six years of age before 
November 1, 1975. 

"I would suggest, if you do 
not have the necessary im-
munizations," commented 
Rogers, "that you begin them 
as soon as possible. Your child 

Both the Farwell and Texico 
school systems have scheduled 
Easter vacations for the 1975 
school year. 

At Farwell, Easter vacation 
will begin at 3:30 p.m. CDT on 
March 21 and students will re-
turn to classes on Monday, 
March 31, to resume their 
studies. 

Texico schools plan the dis-
missal of classes for 3:30 p.m. 
MDT on Friday, March 21. 
Classes will resume at the 
regular hour of 9 a.m. Monday, 
March 31. 

must have the immunizations 
before the start of school next 
year anyway." 

Kindergarten children will 
be permitted to ride the bus to 
school provided the space is a-
vailable. Parents will need to 
pick up their children because 
the kindergarten classes will 
dismiss at 12 noon. Kindergar-
ten hours will begin at 8:30 
a.m. and classes will be con-
ducted in the southwest room 
of the south gymnasium. 

The school will furnish some 
of the supplies to be used by 
kindergarten students. Parents 
must furnish the following: be-
ginner pencil, crayons (eight 
colors), tablet (wide line), 
scissors (blunt point), white 
paste (not liquid), Kleenex 
(small box), and small box for 
supplies. 

It has been said that the 
good a person does is oft inter-
red with their bones and that 
the evil they do lives long 
after. Of course the question 
is: what is good and what is 
evil? In our opinion anything 
that will take away the hard 
won freedoms of the American 
Republic is ultimately evil. 
However good the aim, if the 
result is less personal freedom 
for our citizenry, then it is not 
good. 

Using this line of thinking we 
will comment on Governor 
Dolph Briscoe's remarks to the 
State Legislature as he pre-
sented his proposal for re-
structuring the State's system 
of public schools. Mind you, we 
consider Briscoe's proposal the 
lesser of a number of evils that 
have been put forward by var-
ious pressure groups, but wish 
to point out how we consider 
the pursuit of good ultimately 
living long after as an evil. 

To quote from Briscoe's 
published statement: 

..."It is a proposal to raise 
the floor of educational excel-
lence in this State. It is a pro-
posal to guarantee quality ed-
ucation to every child in 
Texas, regardless of the in-
come of his parents or the 
wealth of his community. 

"...It should be obvious to 
everyone interested in school 
finance that Texas has an in-
equitable school finance sy-
stem that has been described 
appropriately as a 'tax high-
spend low' system for school 
districts poor in property 
wealth per pupil, and a 'tax 
high-spend low' system for 
school districts rich in proper-
ty values per pupil. Within this 
framework, it should be ap-
parent to all that the provision 
of quality educational opportu-
nities is directly and indisput-
ably linked to the ad valorem 
tax base of local communities. 

"It should also be evident 
that a solution to our school 
finance problem has two di-
mensions: (1) the equitable 
distribution of state aid in re-
lationship to identified pupil 
needs and (2) the distribution 
of state aid to local school 
districts in relationship to the 
ability to raise local revenue 
through ad valorem taxation." 

Let us now substitute "Fed-
eral Government" for "State" 
and "Community" and we 
have the blueprint for Wash-
ington ultimately pre-empting 
ALL school taxation and doling 
same back to the states and 
local districts as the Washing-
ton Wizards deem proper. 
There is no argument that with 
the Federals' small contribu-
tion now, they are calling the 
tune to both the state and the 
community. Think how much 
under the Federal big brother 
control we would be if ALL 
school monies flowed from 
Washington. 

Of a necessity, this program 
would be a significant factor in 
the eventual demise of local 
school control. The founding 
fathers in the Constitutional 
Convention of 1788 tried to set 
a balance between the power 
of a Federal government and a 
government similar to the 
Articles of Confederation. The 
result was the American Re-
public in which the power of 
the Federal government was 
supreme in some areas and the 
States and the local commun-
ities were paramount in others. 
This was embodied in our 
"Constitution" and eventually 
produced a country that main-
tained individual liberty at the 
same time it was providing the 
world's standard of living. 

Now while we agree that the 
AIMS of quality education are 
laudable, we think it would be 
better to be slightly underedu-
cated in a Republic, as many 
of our forefathers were, than 
be the smartest puppet in a 
regimented society. 

In theory if you are looking 
for perfect equality in all 
matters then the socialistic 
systems are alluring. However, 
history has written loud and 
clear that socialism DOES 
NOT produce this perfect 
equality and that only the 
American Republic has come 
as close to this ideal as has 
ever been achieved in man-
kind's recorded history. 

You see, the regimented so-
cialistic societies have all 
foundered on the human fac-
tor. It was only the American 
dream that gave free reign to 
the human individualism with-
in each person that produced a 

(Continued on Page 2) 

approximately 10 a.m. on 
March 27, and children in the 
area are invited to watch, as 
the big top is set up, according 
to Jim Walker. 

The Lions Club blood drive 
has been set for April 2 
between the hours of 1 and 7 
p.m. CDT at the Fellowship 
Hall of Hamlin United Memo-
rial Methodist Church in Far-
well. The blood drive is under 
the supervision of Blood Ser-
vices of Lubbock. 

Persons who wish to donate 
blood must be at least 17 years 
of age with parental approval 
and not over the age of 65. 
Donors may be both men and 
women and must weigh at 
least 110 pounds. 
Persons who will be dis-

qualified from donating blood 
include those with a history of 
hepatitis at any age, persons 
who are pregnant or who have 
had major surgery within the 
last six months, and persons 
with a history of unarrested 
clinical tuberculosis, according 
to Walker. 

Donors will automatically 
insure coverage for members 
of their immediate families, 
who might at some time be in 
need of blood. Donors' families 
will be entitled to free blood 
for a period of six months if 
they enter one of the hospitals 
serviced by Blood Services of 
Lubbock. 

Hospitals in the area ser-
viced by Blood Services in-
clude Muleshoe, Clovis, Por-
tales and all hospitals in Lub-
bock, Walker stated. 

"Blood Services regards 
blood as a community asset, 
not a commercial product to be 
bought and sold," Walker 
commented. 

The club is working on the 
possibility of sponsoring a 
similar blood drive every six 
months. Lions are also issuing 
challenges to other civic or-
ganizations and clubs in the 
area to donate blood. 

A $10 reward will be paid to 
the individual who brings in 
the most donors, and a $25 re-
ward will go to the civic group 
that brings in the largest num-
ber of donors, Walker stated. 

Working on this blood drive 
project are all Lions, with 
Howard Carlyle, Jim Walker 
and James Mast coordinating 
efforts. 

FARWELL CHAMBER BANQUET Brig. Gen. Robinson Risner, center, commander of the 
832nd Air Division at Cannon Air Force Base, was guest speaker for the annual banquet of the 
Farwell Chamber of Commerce Thursday, March 13, at the Farwell schools cafeteria. He is 
welcomed to Farwell by Charles Aycock, left and Rev. W. T. Perry, out-going president of the 
Chamber. 

RODEO TROPHIES — Displaying the trophies to be awarded to the high point boy and high 
point girl of the Tri-State High School Rodeo to be conducted March 27, 28 and 29, by the 
Farwell TSHSRA Chapter are, from left, Rudy Sanchez, Jack Foster and Ken Foster. The 
three rodeo club members will be entered in competition during the three-day affair which is 
the second annual edition of the local rodeo. Performances are to begin nightly at 8 p.m. CDT 
at the Farwell Rodeo Arena. Admission has been set at $2 for adults, and $1 for students, with 
children under six years of age being admitted free. Jack serves as president of the local 
chapter while Ken acts as vice-president of the organization. 
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PATRIOTIC DECORATIONS — A patriotic theme was carried 
out in the decorations at the annual banquet of the Farwell 
Chamber of Commerce held at the Farwell schools cafeteria 
on Thursday, March 13. Members of ESA Sorority were 
responsible for all decorations. At left, the scene depicts a 
solider in prayer in Vietnam. The center picture portrays the 

1776 minute men. At right are such patriotic symbols as Uncle 
Sam, the Liberty Bell and recruiting posters. Red and blue 
table runners on white cloths decorated the tables. Miniature 
American flags were mounted in marshmallows and small 
cannons were made of cigars with a burned end and a fuse on 
the other end. Cookies were used for the cannon wheels. 

Centering the head table were Uncle Sam hats in red, white 
and blue. Flower decorations included red carnations, white 
mums and baby's breath. Behind the head table was a salute 
to America from the Farwell Chamber of Commerce featuring 
Abraham Lincoln, George Washington and the raising of the 
flag on Iwo Jima. 
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CPR Training Workshop 

Scheduled For March 28 
Dr. Jerry Don Gregory of 

Farwell will conduct a one-
night workshop demonstration 
training course in Cardio-Pul-
monary Resuscitation (CPR) 
on Friday, March 28. 

The workshop will begin at 
7:30 p.m. CDT in the Commun-
ity Room of Security State 
Bank in Farwell. The work-
shop is open to anyone who is 

„ . (Continued from Page 1) interested in learning the CPR 
technique. 

Basically, the Cardio-Pul-
monary Resuscitation techni-
que is a combination of 
mouth-to-mouth breathing and 
chest compression. CPR train-
ing includes practice with a 
dummy and takes approxi-
mately three hours to com-
plete. 

School Boards, City 
Slate Elections April 5 

Grain Drying Meeting Slated 
A grain drying symposium 

will be conducted in the Friona 
Community Center at 8 p.m. 
Tuesday, March 25. This meet-
ing is being sponsored by the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service and the Panhandle 
Economic Program (PEP). 

Dr. Bill Stewart, agricultural 
engineer, TAMU, will present 
the program on the do's and 
don'ts of grain drying, methods 
of drying grain and types of 

grain driers. 
This meeting is open to the 

public and everyone interested 
in this subject is encouraged to 
attend. Friona Wheat Growers 
will furnish the refreshments. 

Trustees Slate Meet 
The Texico Board of Trus-

tees will meet in routine ses-
sion on Tuesday, March 25, at 
6:30 p.m. MDT at Texico City 
Hall. 

GENERAL COMMISSIONED—
Brig. Gen Robinson Risner, 
left, who presented the keynote 
address at the Farwell Cham-
ber of Commerce banquet is 
presented with a Commission 
as an Honorary Admiral in the 
Texas Navy by Charles Ay-
cock. The commission was 
signed by Gov. Dolph Briscoe. 

be the alternate. Serving as 
clerk will be Alvenia Cox. 

Mayor Gil Patschke, who is 
completing his second term, 
will seek re-election unop-
posed. Two-term incumbent 
Fred Chandler is also running 
unopposed. No person met the 
filing deadline to file for the 
commissioner's place being 
vacated by Jim Berry, so 
write-in votes will be neces-
sary to fill this vacancy. 

Persons who will be out of 
town on election day may vote 
absentee at the Farwell City 
Hall between the hours of 8 
a.m. and 5 p.m. up until four 
days preceding the election, 
according to City Clerk Janie 
Bowery. 

lections in these three towns. 
The three trustees, all in-

cumbents, who have filed for 
re-election are Joe Jones, 
Farwell; Tom Caldwell, Bo-
vina; and Jim Shaffer, Friona. 
The county trustee-at-large 
and the the Lazbuddie trustee 
are not up for re-election this 
year. Terms of the trustees are 
for two years. 

The trustee representing the 
Farwell precinct will be elect-
ed during the Farwell School 
Board election. 

Polling place for the Farwell 
city election will be the Far-
well City Hall. The polling 
place will be open between the 
hours of 7 a.m. and 7 p.m. Kay 
Hagler will be the election 
judge and Wanda Walker will 

Churches To Observe 
Easter With Services.  

well, will deliver a sermon 
based on the Resurrection at 
the morning Easter Sunday 
service, which is scheduled to 
begin at 11 a.m. 

Other churches contacted re-
port they have not planned any 
special services for Easter 
Sunday but will conduct re-
gular Sunday services. 

BOARD OF OF DIRECTORS — The Farwell Chamber of Commerce Board of Directors for 1975 
were introduced at the annual Chamber banquet on March 13. Members of the board are, left 
to right, Toby Booth, Don Williams, Gil Patschke, Jerry Monk, Bo Bartley, Claude (Pudge) 
Rose Jr., Johnny Actkinson and Otis Huggins. Not pictured are directors B.J. Roberts, John 
Dempster and Rev. W.T. Perry, who will be an ex-officio member. 

LETTER TO 
THE EDITOR 

March 8, 1975 
Ruidoso, N.M. 

Dear John & Joann, 
We wanted all of you to know 

of our gratitude and remem-
brance of the many wonderful 
things so many people did for 
us last March when our home 
burned. Use any or all of this. 

Kings, Queens Crowned 

At Children's Banquet 
"western sing along" led by 
guitar playing Pat Owen and 
Rita Dollar. Songs featured 
were "Streets of Laredo," 
"On Bury Me Not on the Lone 
Prairie," Down in the Valley" 
and "Home on the Range." 

Approximately 50 children, 
sponsors and guests attended 
the round-up. Special guests 
were Dr. Cliff Ennen, pastor, 
and his wife 6rol, and Leon 
London, Sunday school super-
intendent. 

Your truly, 
James Ensor 
Box 623 
Ruidoso, N.M. 

Area churches are planning 
observances of Easter Sunday, 
which falls on March 30 this 
year. 

Hamlin Methodist 
The congregation of Hamlin 

Memorial United Methodist 
Church will gather for a 
special Easter communion 
service on Monday Thursday, 
March 27, at 7:30 p.m. Rev. 
W.T. Perry, pastor of the 
church, will present the devo-
tional. 

The topic of Rev. Perry's 
sermon for Easter Sunday will 
be "Let's Take The Trip." 

First Baptist, Texico 
The choir members of the 

First Baptist Church of ,Texico 
will present a "Hallelujah" 
cantata at the evening service 
Easter Sunday, beginning at 
6:30 p.m. Tom Harlan is in 
charge of the program. 

First Baptist, Farwell 
Dr. Cliff Ennen, pastor of the 

First Baptist Church of Far- 

Mervin Beam 
Buried In Ohio 

militarily because of its quality 
of arms. Gen. Risner said 
United States military spend-
ing falls short of that spent by 
the Soviet Union, but is made 
up qualitatively. 

The General received a 
standing ovation following his 
address. Following his pres-
entation, Gen. Risner received 
a surprise from Charles Ay-
cock. Aycock told Gen. Risner 
that the greatest pride to 
Texans is the Texas Navy and 
presented him with a commis-
sion as an Honorary Admiral 
in the Texas Navy. The com-
mission was signed by Gov. 
Dolph Briscoe. 

To carry out the patriotic 
theme of the evening, the ban-
quet hall was decorated with 
colorful murals depicting a 
soldier in prayer in Vietnam, 
the 1776 minute men, Betsy 
Ross and other patriotic 
scenes. Red and blue table 
runners on white cloths de-
corated the tables. Miniature 
American flags were mounted 
in marshmallows and small 
cannons were made of cigars 
with a burned end and a fuse 
on the other end. Cookies were 
used for the cannon wheels. 
ESA Sorority members were 
responsible for all the decora-
tions. 

Centering the head table 
were Uncle Sam hats in red, 
white and blue. Flower decora-
tions included red carnations, 
white mums and baby's 
breath. Behind the head table 
was a salute to America fea-
turing Abraham Lincoln, 
George Washington and the 
raising of the flag on Iwo 

The banquet was served by 
the ladies of the Farwell cafe-
teria. Fred Chandler served as 
chief cook, assisted by Joe 
Jones and Johnny Actkinson. 
The 240 guests enjoyed a meal 
of ribeye steak, tossed salad, 
baked potato, hot rolls and 
butter, apple cobbler, coffee 
and tea. 

Mayor Gil Patschke gave the 
benediction, thus concluding 
the evening's activities, and 
the most successful banquet in 
the history of the Farwell 
Chamber of Commerce passed 
into the annals of history. 

Purely 
Personal . . . 

(Continued from Page 1) 
country that has been the 
guiding star of the world for 
almost 200 years. And this in 
spite of admitted inequities in 
many areas. When you shackle 
the inner spirit, for whatever 
reason, you have gone back-
ward in the march toward hu-
man betterment. 

We question the value of 
"quality education" at the 
expense of personal freedom. 

P.S. We enjoy the Tribune. 
(Editor's Note!, See "Letter 

To The Community From The 
James Ensor Family" else-
where in this issue.) 

Funeral services were con-
ducted March 10 in Toledo, 
Ohio, for Mervin Beam, 78, 
longtime resident of the Texi-
co-Farwell area. 

Mr. Beam was born Nov. 12, 
1896, and died March 6 in the 
Veteran's Hospital in Amarillo. 

He suffered a stroke Feb. 3 
at his residence in Farwell. He 
was taken to the Clovis 
hospital and later transferred 
to the Amarillo hospital. 

Bookmobile Schedule 

Vacancies on the Boards of 
Trustees of the Lazbudaie, 
Farwell and Parmer County 
School Boards and the Farwell 
City Commission will all be 
filled in elections scheduled for 
Saturday, April 5. 

Two vacancies exist on the 
Board of Trustees of the Laz-
buddie Independent School 
District. The terms of Orville 
Burnett and Reaford Wenner 
are expiring, with Burnett not 
seeking re-election. 

Names on the ballot will 
include Keith Menefee, Claude 
(Greg) Gregory, Max Stein-
bock, Reaford Wenner, Alfred 
Hicks, Bill Brantley and Jim 
Roy Daniel. 

The election will be conduct-
ed at the auditorium building 
of the Lazbuddie schools, with 
Frank Hinkson Sr. as presiding 
judge. Don McDonald and Bill 
Jennings will serve as clerks. 
The poll will open at 7 a.m. 
and will close at 7 p.m. 

Mrs. Murrell Johns has been 
appointed clerk for absentee 
voting which will be conducted 
in the office of Superintendent 
Sam Barnes up until four days 
preceding the election. Hours 
for absentee voting are from 8 
a.m. to 4 p.m. 

Polling place in the election 
for Board of Trustees of the 
Farwell Independent School 
District is the County Court-
room of the Parmer County 
Courthouse. The poll will be 
open from 8 a.m. to 7 p.m. 
April 5. 

Farwell voters will elect two 
members to the school board. 
Walter Hughes, incumbent, is 
not seeking re-election and 
incumbent Charles Aycock is 
up for re-election. 

Candidates on the ballot will 
include Joe Hughes, LaMoin 
Williams, Gerald Curtis, Char-
les Aycock, C. R. Dale and 
David White. 

Albert Smith will serve as 
presiding judge for the Farwell 
school board election, and Mrs. 
Albert Smith will serve as the 
clerk. 

Bonnie Warren, Parmer 
County Clerk, has been ap-
pointed as clerk for absentee 
voting and Mildred Erwin as 
deputy clerk. Absentee voting 
will be conducted in the County 
Clerk's office in the Parmer 
County Courthouse between the 
hours of 8 a.m. and 5 p.m. up 
until four days preceding the 
election. 

Three members of the Par-
mer County School Board of 
Trustees will be elected April 5 
to serve the Farwell, Bovina 
and Friona precincts, during 
the respective school board e- 

C of C Banquet 
Milam County, Tex., and he 
and his wife and two daughters 
moved to the Farwell area on 
Jan. 1, 1966. He has been 
active in radio work all his life, 
and is presently owner of radio 
station KZOL in Farwell. 

Patschke is a member of the 
Texico-Farwell Rotary Club 
and served as president of that 
organization in 1970. He is also 
an active member of the Far-
well Chamber of Commerce. 

The Patschke family belongs 
to Hamlin United Memorial 
Methodist Church and he is a 
member of the Administrative 
Board. He also teaches the 
Bible Sunday School Class. 
Patschke is an active partici-
pant in lay witness missions 
around the area and recently 
attended a lay speaker school 
at Sacramento, N.M. 

Gil Patschke was elected 
mayor of Farwell in 1973, and 
is presently running for an-
other term on the Farwell City 
Commission. 

Mrs. Joe (Gwen) Hughes has 
resided in Farwell since 1966. 
She is the mother of two child-
ren and is involved in many 
school activities. Mrs. Hughes 
volunteered many hours within 
the kindergarten program last 
year and volunteered this year 
to help with registration and 
room parties. She is presently 
serving as the community-par-
ent representative on the 
Steering Committee for Far-
well Elementary School's self-
evaluation project. She has 
served as chairwoman of the 
Christmas Card Project in the 
past, and continues to work for 
this cause. 

Mrs. Hughes has served as a 
den mother for the Farwell-
Texico Cub Scouts for the past 
two years. She is this year's 
chairwoman for the Cancer 
Drive for Farwell and has 
marched for this cause in pre-
vious years. She belongs to the 
First Baptist Church of Far-
well. 

Charles Aycock introduced 
the guest speaker for the eve-
ning, Gen. Risner, who dis-
cussed the freedoms enjoyed 
by Americans, which are often 
taken for granted. "We are 
free thinkers, and that's the 
main difference between us 
and the people who live under 
Communist rule," Gen. Risner 
stated. 

Gen. Risner was held- a 
prisoner of war for seven years 
by the North Vietnamese. He 
has written an account of his 
years in captivity in a book en-
titled "The Passing of the 
Night." In recounting his years 
as a P.O.W., Gen. Risner 
stated, "There was a prison 
guard who had absolute control 
of life and death over me. At 
times when he'd lock me in my 
cell, I'd think, 'If I could only 
trade places with him.' " 

"One day another prisoner 
whispered to me, 'I'd never 
trade places with that guard 
because I'm proud to be an 
American.' " Gen. Risner said 
the statement made him stop 
and reconsider his extreme 
loneliness. It made him think 
deeply of the countless free-
doms Americans experience. 

Gen. Risner compared the 
United States' military 
strenghts to Russia's stating 
that Russia is ahead in quan-
tity of arms, but the United 
States remains number one 

Thursday, March 27: Okla. 
Lane, 9:00 - 10:00; Rhea Com-
munity, 10:45 - 11:45; Friona 
01, 1:00 - 1:30; and Black, 1:45 
- 2:45. 

Friday, March 28: Hub, 8:45 
- 9:45; White's Elevator, 10:00 -
11:00; Lazbuddie, 12:00 - 1:00; 
and Clay's Corner, 1:15 - 2:15. 

Saturday, March 29: Will not 
run. 

(barbecued beef ), buckshot 
(pinto beans), tumbleweeds 
(potato chips), prickley pear 
(pickles), cactus salad (gela-
tin), flapjacks and saddle soap 
(hot rolls and butter), ranger's 
delight (strawberry shortcake) 
and prairie brew (tea). 

Special speaker, Kirby Car-
roll from the Bovina Baptist 
Church, was introduced by Bo 
Bartley, fifth and sixth grade 
director. Carroll spoke on 
"round-up time" in the church 
as applied to the children's age 
group. 

Rita Dollar conducted 
"branding time" which was 
the crowning of kings and 
queens of the two class divi-
sions for the most faithful at-
tendance and work in their 
Sunday school classes. 

King and Queen of the third 
and fourth grades were Fred 
Troub and Shana Blain. Crown-
ed for the fifth and sixth 
grades were Todd Geries and 
Robin Ennen. 

Entertainment for the eve-
ning was in the form of a 

The Annual Children's Spring 
Banquet was held Tuesday, 
March 11, in Fellowship Hall of 
the First Baptist Church in 
Farwell in conjunction with the 
crowning of class kings and 
queens. 

The event is hosted each 
Spring by the Sunday school 
teachers and Children's De-
partment directors of the 
church. Theme for this year's 
banquet, "Spring Round-up," 
was the cue for an extensive 
western setting for the eve-
ning's affair. In charge of the 
decorations was Joy Chadwick. 

Silhouetted in black on the 
walls of the hall were cowboy 
action figures and western 
scenery. In one corner of the 
banquet room were bales of 
hay and a saddle. Cowboy 
boots and kerchiefs formed the 
centerpieces for each table. 
Programs were in the design 
of covered wagons and were 
written in the "lingo" of the 
old west. 

Reflecting the theme was the 
night's menu of dried jerky 

Dig this, Daddies! 
Have a health checkup once 

a year for your own sake and 
for the sake of your family, 
urges the American Cancer 
Society. SMED—TODD 

FUNERAL HOME 

"Our Family Serving Your Family" 

Prince and Manana - Clovis, Ph. 763-5541 

You Can Trust... 
Your Insurance 
Headquarters DEKALB 

Seed ,coyn, EARLY! ALDRIDGE 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

_Farwell  Calvin Meissner—Ph. 925-3110 
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RELAY COMPETITORS, CROWD - The Third Annual Twin 
Cities Relay track meet was conducted Saturday, March 15, at 
FarVell High School under the sponsorship of the Texico-Far-
well Lions Club. A total of 38 teams, approximately 450 indi-
vidual competitors, were entered in the meet which was term-
ed "most successful" by Lions Club representatives. Despite 

the cool, windy weather which prevailed throughout the day 
Saturday, a large crowd of spectators turned out for the 
annual event. In competition, the Friona boys tracksters and 
Nazareth girls team accumulated the largest number of points 
to garner honors as first place teams. These teams were 
awarded trophies for their accomplishments. 
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TEXICO FFA JUDGING TEAM -- Friday and Saturday, March 14 and 15, the Future 
Farmers of America judgers of the Texico FFA Chapter attended the Texas Tech judging 
meet in Lubbock where they competed against other New Mexico schools and were recipients 

•of the second place banner. Members of the second place team are, left to right, David 
Turnbough, Richard Hadley, Sammy West, Roger Pace and Monty Leavell. West also came 
back with second place high individual overall competition. The judging team scored 1260 
points out of a possible 1500. The top three out of the five boys made up the total points. Top 
three were West with 436, Hadley with 415 and Pace with 409. 

Sponsored Bv Lions - - 
Friona, Nazareth Take Firsts 
At Annual Twin Cities Relay 

pastries. 
Jim Walker, on behalf of the 

local Lions Club, issued the 
following statement: 

"The Texico-Farwell Lions 
Club would like to thank all the 
local men and boys who helped 
with the Twin Cities Relay. A 
special thanks goes to the 
ladies who worked in the 
concession stand, the field 
house and the lunchroom in 
preparing meals." 

Individual and team placings 
in the various events of the 
meet are as follows: 

And Jr. High - - 
Honor List Released At Texico School 

chett, Mike Scott, Pam South-
ard and Teresa Turner. 

SEVENTH: Roxanne Cher-
ry, Kelly Dobbs, Kerri Dona- 

hey, Teresa Doolittle, Neal 
Haile, Lori Harrington, Beth 
Kelley, Alan Moss, Cindy Tay-
lor and Jeff Tharp. 

County Agents Present 

Films To 4-H Club 

BOYS 

Tambolin. Sudan. 32' 9"; 4. Joyce, 
Morton 31' 2"; 5. Goldsmith, Dimmitt. 30' 
1034"; 6. Whither, Texico, 29' 2". 

60-YARD DASH - 1. Rivers. Dimmitt, 
7.5; 2. Tomes, Amherst. 7.55; 3. 
Schacher. Nazareth, 7.6; 4. Jackson, 
Adrian. 7.65; 5. Weaver. Amherst, 7.7; 6. 
Weaver. Sudan, 8.3. 

HIGH JUMP - 1. Young, Amherst. 4' 
10"; 2. Sawyer. L'Field, 4' 9"; 3. Booth, 
Farwell, 4' 8"; 4. Schultz. Nazareth. 4' 
8"; 5. Naegle. Bovina. 4' 8"; 6. 
Littlefield, 4' 8". 

DISCUS - 1. Shepheard. Bovina. 96' 8"; 
2. Steffens. Nazareth, 96' 71/2"; 3. Hands. 
Happy. 96' 41/4"; 4. Garin, Amherst, 86' 
5"; 5. Morris, Smyer, 84'; 6. Southland. 
Chaffin, 80' 5". 

80-YARD HURDLES -- 1. Lawson. 
Lovington 11.3; 2. Schulete, Nazareth, 
12.3; 3. Daniels. SpLake, 12.8; 4. Tatum, 
Happy, 13.; 5. Carter. Texllne, 13.05; 6. 
Whittier. Texico. 14. 

880-YARD RELAY 	1 Nazareth. 

1:56.6; 2. Bovina, 1:58.4; 3. L'Field, 1:59; 
4. Texico. 1:59.1; 5. Farwell, 1:59.4; 6. 
Morton. 1:59.9 

100-YARD DASH - 1. Rivers, Dimmitt, 
12.0; 2. Robinson. Sudan 12.01; 3. 
Johnson. L'Fleld. 12.6; 4. Broderson, 
Dimmitt, 12.1; 5. Weaver. Sudan 12.15; 6. 
Davis, H. Center, 12.4; 7. Jackson. 
Adrian, 12.6. 

220-YARD DASH - 1. Weaver. Sudan. 
27.1; 2. Broderson, Dlmmltt. 27.5; 3. 
Davis. H. Center. 27.6; 4. Lawson. 
Lovington, 28; 5. Johnson. Sudan 28.4; 6. 
Garin. Amherst 28.9. 

880-YARD DASH - 1. Waits, H. Center. 
2:41; 2. Ennen. Farwell, 2:43; 3. 
Buxkemper, Southland, 2:43.6; 4. Rodri-
quez. Dimmitt, 2:46; 5. Hockstein, 
Nazareth, 2:46.05; 6. McCully, Farwell, 
2:47. 

MILE RELAY - 1. Llttlefleld. 4:26.7; 2. 
Farwell. 4:31.3; 3. Nazareth, 4:35.8; 4. 
Bovina, 4:46.5; 5. Springlake. 4:54.2; 6. 
Texllne. 5:10.9. 

Members and leaders pres-
ent prepared favors for the 
rest home. Wanna Menning is 
responsible for delivering the 
items. 

Refreshments of cookies, 
candies and soft drinks were 
served by Mrs. Gilbert Kalt-
wasser to 4-H'ers Cheryl and 
Linda Gohlke, Yalonda and 
William Martin, Rodger and 
Charles Johnson, Johanna and 
Berny Mesman, and leaders, 
Mary Helen Gohlke, Mary 
Mesman, Jana Pronger, and 
Mack Heald. 

***** 

Winfred Long of Farwell 
remains a patient in the Clovis 
hospital where he was admit-
ted Monday, March 17, and 
underwent surgery Tuesday. 
According to his mother, Mrs. 
Ouida Long, he is "doing fair." 

Oklahoma Lane 4-H Club 
met Tuesday, March 18, in the 
Community Center. 4-H Motto 
was led by Berny Mesman 
with Rodger Johnson leading 
the Pledge of Allegiance. 
Meeting was called to order by 
President Linda Gohlke. 

Johanna Mesman gave a 
report on the County Food 
Show and Cheryl Gohlke re-
ported on the County Council 
Meeting and the District Food 
Show. 
• The group discussed upcom-
ing demonstrations and field 
trips which are now underway. 

Special portion of the pro-
gram was presented by Jana 
Pronger, County Extension 
Agent, and Mack Heald, Coun-
ty Agent, who presented a film 
strip on what 4-H is all about, 
what 4-H'ers can do and learn, 
and a film on the new 4-H 
building in Brownwood. 

James Pierce, principal of 
Texico High and Junior High 
schools, has released the list of 
honor roll students for the first 
nine weeks of the second se-
mester of studies. 

Included on the list are: 
SENIORS: Beverly Duncan, 

Roy Hagler, Steve Harrington, 
Ricky Hendrix, Elaine Kelley, 
Freda Leavell, Thomas Nab-
ours, Elizabeth Pierce, Char-
lotte Smith, David Turnbough, 
Max Winkles, Jeanne Wine-
geart and Ernest Woods. 

JUNIORS: Gia Crooks, Val-
erie Fitz, Terri Gleaton, Sheila 
Hall, Rusty Rucker, Vicki 
Snodgrass and Spencer Turner. 

SOPHOMORES: Deanne Day, 
Mark Howard, Debbie Ledbet-
ter, Betty Jo Peugh, Susan 
Snodgrass and Deborah Steph-
ens. 

FRESHMEN: Debra Coffey, 
Lyndon Donahey, Don Duncan, 
Karen Hadley, Blake Haile, 
Christi Harrington, Debra 
Johnson, Richard Kelley, Sa-
brina Kittrell, Cindy Perkins, 
Terry Rucker, Steve Turner 
and Leona Webb. 

EIGHTH: Sheryl Day, Geor-
gia Eshleman, Tonye Harring-
ton, Karen Harrison, Ben Prit- 

the Japanese believe that the 
ages of 19, 33, 42 and 47 are 
bad luck. 

SCHOLARSHIP RECIPIENT - Cleo Ainsworth, left, chairman 
of the Clovis Production Credit Association, presents Dwayne 
Kelley of Texico with a scholarship to ENMU. The presenta-
tion ceremony was conducted during the 41st annual meeting 
of the PCA Thursday, March 13, in the Campus Union Build-
ing Ballroom at Eastern New Mexico University in Portales. 
Dwayne Kelley is the son of Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Kelley of 
Texico. Also held during the meeting was an election to the 
PCA Board of Directors. Troy L. Lovett of Texico was re-e-
lected to the board by acclamation. 

880-YARD DASH 	1. McClellan, 
Friona, 2:10.2; 2. Graham, Lovington, 
2:11.3; 3. McCran. Lovington. 2:11.4; 4. 
Jungman, Llttlefleld, 2:14.5 5. Pierce. 
Amherst. 2:19; 6. Villarreal, Bovina. 
2:21. 

POLE VAULT - 1. Booth, Amherst. 
11'; 2. Clark. Friona. 11'; 3. Jones. Far-
well, 11'; 4. Williams, Amherst. 10' 6"; 5. 
Patterson, Llttlefleld, 10'; 6. Wall, 
Lazbuddle. 10'. 

BROAD JUMP - 1. Sowder. Three 
Way, 19' 31/4 "; 2. Zet.zsche, Friona. 19' 2". 
3. Phillips, Farwell, 19' 1/4"; 4. Huseman, 
Nazareth, 18' 814"; 5. Goss, Littlefield, 
18' 534"; 6. Welch, Friona, 18' 534". 

SHOT PUT - 1. Stower, Friona, 46' 
101/2" New Record; 2. Hopping, Little-
field. 46' 814"; 3. McDonald, Lovington. 
43' 10"; 4. Shelby, Bovina. 42' 2"; 5. Hall. 
Littlefield. 40' 914"; 6. Wiseman. Friona, 
40' 11/2". 

DISCUS - 1. Carthel. Friona. 145' 9"; 2. 
Wiseman. Friona. 144' 7"; 3. McDonald 
139' 8"; 4. Joiner. Nazareth. 138' 4"; 5. 
Hopping, L'Field.136' 5"; 6. Turner. 
L'Fleld, 128' 8"; 7. Warren, Lovington, 
114' 3"; 8. Sabala, Morton. 113' 7". 

120-YARD HURDLES -- 1. Hooper. 
Lovtngton, 15.7; 2. Harmon, Amherst, 
15.8; 3. Rector, Friona. 16.6; 5. Pickett, 
Sudan. 16.75; 6. Strickland, Friona, 17.6. 

HIGH JUMP - 1. Cleveland, Friona. 6'; 
2. O'Neil, Alamo Catholic; 3. Hooper. 
Lovington; 4. Strickland. Friona; 5. Goss, 
L'Field; 6. Marks, Lovtngton. 

440-YARD RELAY - 1. Farwell, 45.9; 
2. Morton, 46.4; 3. Littlefield. 46.5; 4. 
Lovington 47.6; 5. Friona, 47.7; 6. 
Amherst. 48.5; 7. Sudan, 48.6. 

440-YARD DASH - 1. Garza, Farwell, 
52.7; 2. Turner. L'Field, 52.8; 3. Bellah. 
Lovington, 53.9; 4. Patterson, L'Field, 
55.1; 5. Cruz. L'Fleld, 55.15; 6. Deleon. 
Bovina, 57.7; 7. Messamore. Sudan, 58.2. 

330-YARD I. H. - 1. Hooper, Lovington. 
44.7; 2 Rector, Friona. 45.0; 3. Smith, 
Lovington. 45.9; 4. Christian, Farwell, 
46.1; 5. Harmoin. Amherst. 46.7; 6. Jones. 
Farwell. 46.8. 

100-YARD DASH - 1. Woods, Farwell. 
10.3; 2. Ramby. Morton, 10.35; 3. Craft. 
Farwell. 10.4; 4. Stewart. Texico. 10.5; 5. 
Zetzche. Friona, 10.55; 6. Butcher, 
Lovington. 10.7; 7. Robinson. Sudan. 10.8. 

220-YARD DASH - 1. Woods, Farwell. 
24.00; 2. Ramby. Morton. 24.0; 3. 
Sterling. Amherst, 24.3; 4. Phillips, 
Farwell, 24.4; 5. Amherst. Johnson. 24.7; 
6. Stewart. Texico. 24.8; 7. Blbbs. 
Farwell. 25.6. 

MILE RUN - 1. Aguilar. Lovington. 5:09; 
2. Cowan. L'Fleld. 5:09.5; 3. Brikenfleld. 
Nazareth. 5:22; 4. Soria, L'Field.5:23; 5. 
Cardona, Southland. 5:25; 6. Garza. 
Lovtngton. 5:27; 7. Patterson, Friona. 
5:30. 

MILE RELAY - 1. Llttlefleld, 3:38.2; 2. 
Friona, 3:46; 3. Lovington, 3:46.4; 4. 
Sudan, 3:49.1; 5. Amherst. 3:49.9; 6. 
Farwell. 3:52. 

32 Oz. Bottle Plus Dep. 

Colatola 3/1.00 
Pringle's Twin Pack 	9 Oz. 	70c 
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$139 Each 
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VELVEETA 77  

Tracksters from Friona and 
Nazareth took home the boys 
and girls team trophies, re-
spectively, following the con-
clusion of "a most successful 
session" of the Third Annual 
Twin Cities Relay. The annual 
event was staged Saturday, 
March 15, at Farwell High 
School and was hosted by the 
Texico-Farwell Lions Club. 

Friona's boys accumulated 
111 team points to garner the 
first place win with Lovington, 
N.M., taking second place 
honors with 98 points. Other 
teams placing in the top six 
were Littlefield, third, 84; 
Farwell, fourth, 74; Amherst, 
fifth, 46; and Morton, sixth, 37. 

In girls competition, Naza-
reth came up with a total of 
107 team points for the first 
place win. They were followed 
by Littlefield, second, 65; 
Bovina. third, 62; Amherst, 
fourth, 53; Sudan, fifth, 53; and 
Farwell, sixth, 41 points. 

Two new records were set 
during the meet with Kathy 
Booth of Farwell setting a time 
of 1:03.5 in the girls 440-yard 
dash, and Stower of Friona 
hurling the shot put 46'101 2" in 
boys competition. 

Awards presented following 
the conclusion of the meet 
were medals to the first three 
places in each event, boys and 
girls, and trophies to the 
championship teams, sprint 
relay and mile relay. Scoring 
for the meet was 10-8-6-4-2-1 in 
individual events and 20-16-12-
8-4-2 in relays. 

A total of 38 teams were 
entered in the competition with 
approximately 450 individual 
competitors listed on the entry 
forms. 

Among the girls teams par-
ticipating were Amherst, Lit-
tlefield, Nazareth, Sudan, Tex-
ico, Adrian, Hart, Bovina, 
Springlake-Earth, 	Texline, 
Amherst, Southland, Logan, 
N.M., Morton, Dimmitt, Happy 
Smyer, Chaffin, Lovington, 
N.M., Hale Center, Kress, Lit-
tlefield and Farwell. 

Boys teams competing in-
cluded Friona, Lovington, 
N.M., Littlefield, Amherst, Bo-
vina, Lazbuddie, Three Way, 
Nazareth, Morton, Sudan, Ala-
mo Catholic, Texico, South-
land and Farwell. 

The meet was sponsored by 
the Texico-Farwell Lions Club 
under the direction of track 
committee members James 
Craig, Jim Walker, Eugene 
Jennings, Don Geries, John 
Curtis and Toby Booth. 

The Lions Club not only 
sponsored the meet, but re-
cruited Lionesses of the local 
club members to man the 
concession stand and serve a 
hot lunch to tracksters partici-
pating in the meet. Also this 
year, a new Lioness project 
was instituted in the form of a 
coaches reception. Coaches 
from the various teams were 
invited to the field house 
during the day were they were 
served sandwiches, fried 
chicken, chips and dips, candy, 
nuts, coffee, cold drinks and 

3 lb. Can  

CRISCO $1.19  

440-YARD RELAY • 1. Amherst. 53.2; 
2. Littlefield. 54.1; 3. Nazareth, 54.2; 4. 
Sudan, 54.5; 5. Texico. 54.7; 6. Adrian, 
55.6; 7. Hart. 56.3. 

TRIPLE JUMP - 1. Schacher, Nazar-
eth. 33' 934"; 2. Naegle. Bovina 32' 31/2"; 
3. Sulser, SpLake, 31' 1"; 4. Hack. 
Nazareth. 30' 101/4 "; 5. Acker. Nazareth. 
30' 4"; 6. Qualls. Texllne, 29' 8". 

BROAD JUMP - 1. Schacher. Nazar-
eth. 15' 9"; 2. Garth. Amherst. 15' 814"; 
3. Heck, Nazareth, 15' 61/2". 4. Naegle. 
Bovina 15' 2"; 5. Johnson, Littlefield. 14' 
11"; 6. Basinger. Southland. 

440-YARD DASH - 1. Booth. Farwell. 
1:03.5. new record; 2. Robinson, Sudan. 
1:04.3; 3. Wart), Logan, 1:05.8; 4. 
Gilbreath, Bovina, 1:05.8; 5. Heck, 
Nazareth, 1:06.6; 6. Norton, Farwell, 
1:09.5. 

SHOT PUT - 1. Shepheard. Bovina, 
341/4' 1/2"; 2. Hands, Happy. 33' 2"; 3. 

%dine 46 OL Size 	49' 
TOMATO JUICE Shurfine Whole 16 Oz. Size 

CRANBERRY SAUCE 

5/1.00 s• 	• '• • • 	 • 
10 Oz. Folger's 

INSTANT COFFEE $1.89 Jar 

22 Oz. Size 

JOY 	59' 

WE 

ACCEPT 

FOOD 

STAMPS 

ALLSUP'S 
CONVENIENCE 

STORES 

HOT BAR-B-Q 

DAILY 

DONUTS 

ICEES 

POPCORN 

MONEY ORDERS 

CUBED ICE 

YOUR 24 HOUR CONVENIENCE STORE 1201 E. First St. 	763-4437 

Prefinished Paneling - Several Patterns 12.97 

PREFINISHED MOULDINGS & COLORED NAILS 

4 X 8 3/8 CID Plywood $4.80 

4 X 8 1/2  CID 	15.76 

Nails per Lb. 	 45° 

FREE DELIVERY TO 

TEXICO FARWELL 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

. ; 	, 	• . 	t-',`7**1 4, , • 	•• 1",0 

, 
Hospital 'Notes 

Dread Hammit, Sr. of Texico 
was admitted March 12 to 
University Hospital in Lubbock 
where he underwent surgery 
for a broken hip March 14. His 
son, D. E. Hammit, Jr., 
reports that his father is 
"doing fine" but he would 
enjoy receiving letters from 
his friends as he will remain 
hospitalized for sometime. 
Letters may be sent to Mr. 
Hammit, University Hospital, 
Room 217 A, Lubbock. 

Mrs. W. W. Hall of Farwell 
was transferred to Golden Age 
Rest Home in Clovis March 12 
from the Clovis hospital where 
she had been a patient since 
March 2 when she suffered a 
stroke. Her daughter, Mrs. H. 
B. Bell, reports Mrs. Hall is 
still in poor condition. 

***** 

Mrs. Eugene Smith of Far-
well was dismissed from Clovis 
Memorial Hospital March 13 
and is recuperating at home. 
Mrs. Smith entered the hospi-
tal March 1 after suffering a 
mild stroke. 

***** 

Rev. Robert Roberts of 
Pleasant Hill was released 
from the Clovis 'Hospital Sun-
day, March 16, after under-
going surgery and reports he is 
"doing fine" recuperating at 
his home. Rev. Roberts was 
admitted to the hospital March 
13 and underwent surgery 
March 14. 

***** 

Kent Gast of Farwell was 
dismissed from the Clovis 
hospital Friday, March 14, 
after undergoing a tonsillecto-
my March 13. He is at home 
and is reported to be "recover-
ing quickly." 

***** 

Elwanda Wood of Farwell 
was admitted to Clovis Me-
morial Hospital Sunday, March 
16, and underwent surgery 
March 18. According to a 
family member, Mrs. Wood is 
"doing as well as can be 
expected." 

Borden's Round Carton 

ICE CREAM 	99' 
All Kinds and Sizes Light Bulbs 
Buy One Get One FREE 

CARD OF THANKS 
The Texico-Farwell Lions Club would 

like to thank all the local men and boys 
who helped with the Twin Cities Relay. 
A special thanks goes to the ladies who 
worked in the concession stand and the 
lunchroom in preparing meals. 

We Are . . . 

4411484t. 

Looking . 
To Serving Your 

Farm Supply Needs, 

Every Day, In Every Way 

MI•11111•1111111MINK 

OKLAHOMA LANE 
FARM SUPPLY 

825-1345 
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By Methodist Women - - 
Texico, Farwell Seniors Honored With Banquet 

sented by Steve Harrington, 
president of the Texico senior 
class, and Donnie Garner, 
president of the Farwell senior 
class. 

Entertainment for the eve-
ning was provided by Michael 
Farris and Signe Hart. Farris 
served as pianist while Miss 
Hart presented musical selec-
tions including "You Just Call 
Out My Name," "Nobody 
Know," "Wanting You the Way 
I Do" and "The Way We 
Were." 

Guest speaker for the eve-
ning was Rev. Clyde Stanfield 
of Trinity United Methodist 
Church of Clovis. Rev. Stan-
field expressed his desire to i-
dentify with the seniors and 
spoke to the classes on how 
they may go through school 
getting advice. 

In illustration of his theme, 
Rev. Stanfield used the ex-
ample of when he was a high 

school student. He stressed to 
the group the many things 
which can be done with advice- 
which they receive during their 
lives. The speaker discussed 
setting goals and the impor-
tance of reaching personal 
goals. 

Approximately 100 persons 
were present for the banquet 
during which a meal of baked 
chicken, green beans, baked 
potatoes, pear salad, rolls, 
butter, sherbet, tea and coffee 
were served. 

Acting as servers for the oc-
casion were Kathy Booth, 
Peggy White. Vicki Snodgrass, 
Susan Snodgrass, Kim Mag-
ness, Kristi Magness, Pam 
Parr and Christi Harrington. 
The servers were attired in 
spring dresses over which they 
wore small aprons of various 
spring colors. 

The banquet concluded with 
the benediction by Rev. Perry. 

9 Wad Bite Ta Elmo 	Sigezte 

Tiotho Ta AQE Iftembeu3 O6 Titio 
Fat itilahigg 9t A Race 9ii Mirk Ta Due 

Moe Malty 06 96 Cili3eas Atte %pitted 

Ta Sefwire. 	&u1 14 ilwieciate The Haan 

Beim Coat "Wawa 06 The gem" 
Agd Pali* Waal Ta 	{My Faistibi 

Fax Doh Aid Duitigg Tke Time 9 WO6 	• 
Sehligg Nit etlittittUgilli. 

Gag flugle 

Easter was the theme as the 
senior classes of both Farwell 
and Texico high schools gath-
ered Tuesday, March 18, at 
Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church in Farwell 
for a banquet in their honor 
sponsored by the United Meth-
odist Women of the church. 

Easter decorations dominat-
ed the Fellowship Hall as each 
table had been covered with 
white and enhanced by either 
stripes of yellow and green, or 
yellow and purple down the 
table centers. 

One serving table had been 
centered with an arrangement 
of a large paper Easter egg 
topped with a bunny and sur-
rounded by mushrooms and 
chicks nested in pink and yel-
low Easter grass. Also resting 
on the table were paper bun-
nies and grass nests holding 
brightly colored Easter eggs. 

Another table was centered 
with a wooden cart which had 
been filled with flowers and 
greenery. The small grass 
nests also had been placed on 
the table. 

The third dining table had 

BANQUET ATTENDANTS -- The Texico and Farwell senior classes were honored Tuesday, 
March 18, with a banquet at Hamlin Memorial United Methodist Church. The banquet was 
sponsored by the United Methodist Women and was attended by approximately 100 persons 
including seniors, class sponsors, class parents and special guests. Among those in attend-
ance were, from left, Donnie Garner, Farwell senior class president; Rev. Clyde Stanfield, 
guest speaker from Trinity United Methodist Church in Clovis; Mrs. Aileen Teel, president of 
the UMW; Rev. W. T. Perry, pastor; and Steve Harrington, Texico senior class president. 

East end of the banquet 
room had been enhanced with 
a large table covered in white, 
striped with one yellow and 
one green streamer. Centering 
the table was a large yellow 
Easter egg which was topped 
with a yellow bow and a ring of 
paper flower ring and was 
flanked by two yellow tapers in 
crystal holders surrounded by 
green grass. 

Serving as master of cere-
monies for the evening was 
Rev. W.T. Perry with the in-
vocation being given by Jack 
Williams, Farwell High School 
principal. 

Introductions of special 
guests were made including 
class sponsors and parents. 
Sponsors of the Texico senior 
class are Mr. and Mrs. Bucky 
Walters and Mrs. Bud Peyton. 
Class parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Moreland Harrington, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.D. Kelley, Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Duncan and Mrs. W.O. 
Reid. Also introduced were the 
wives of Texico school superin-
tendent and principal, Mrs. 
A.D. McDonald and Mrs. 
James Pierce, respectively. 

Serving as class sponsors for 
the Farwell senior class are 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Har-
grove. Class parent attending 
the banquet was Mrs. T.J. Kit-
trell. Superintendent and Mrs. 
W.M. Roberts and Principal 
Williams were also recognized. 

Mrs. Aileen Teel, president 
of the UMW, gave the wel-
come, and response was pre- 

been decorated with a large 
straw basket adorned with 
green bows dotted with pink 
flowers. Adding to the table 
decoration were two smaller 
baskets holding Easter eggs 
and bunnies. 

Final table decoration in-
cluded an Easter bunny sitting 
in a nest of grass and sur-
rounded by smaller bunnies. 
Each place had been marked 
with colored plastic eggs and 
banquet programs of various 
colors. 

Head table for the banquet 
was covered in white with 
stripes of pink and green run-
ning the length of the table. 
Background for the table was a 
white Easter egg tree with 
colored Easter eggs suspended 
from its branches. Also serving 
as a background was a table 
covered with pink foil on which 

two large paper bunnies had 
been placed. Completing the 
table decorations was a straw 
horn of plenty overflowing with 
colored eggs nestled in green 
grass. 

Suspended from the ceiling 
fixtures in the room were large 
flower heads which were either 
magneta, yellow and green in 
color. Butterflies of various 
colors were placed along the 
walls of the room. The window 
sills were lined with crepe 
paper streamers of yellow and 
green upon which crepe paper 
flowers of various colors were 
placed. 

Farwell Study Club 
Members At Confab 

Jewel Scott, president; Mrs. 
Christian, secretary; and Mrs. 
Loucile Foster. 

While in Lubbock, the Far-
well members were guests in 
the home of Mrs. Grace Jones, 
who had recently moved from 
Farwell to Lubbock. 

Texico Woman's Club 
Sets Called Meeting 

SUIT YOURSELF 

Members of the Texico 
Woman's Club will have a 
special called meeting on 
Monday, March 24, at 7 p.m. in 
the 1 exico Community Build-
ing. 

Purpose of the meeting is to 
elect new officers for the club. 
All members are urged to be 
present for the election, stated 

Mrs. Marie Christian, club 
president. 

The nominating committee 
will present a suggested slate 
of officers, with the club 
members voting at the Monday 
meeting. The nominating com-
mittee is composed of Marcia 
Leavell, Ann Ledbetter, Mar-
sha Reid, Margie Crooks and 
Norma Rogers. 

I.:NTERTAINERS -- Entertainment for the 1975 Texico-Far-
well Senior Banquet was provided by Michael Farris and 
Signe Hart. Farris accompanied Miss Hart on the piano as she 
presented several vocal selections. The banquet was held 
Tuesday, March 18, at Hamlin Memorial United Methodist 
Church and was sponsored by the United Methodist Women. 

Visit In Arizona, New Mexico 
Mrs, G.H. "Ma" Schooling of 

Farwell and two companions 
retuned home Thursday, 
March 14, after spending a 
week in New Mexico and Ari-
zona visiting with friends and 
relatives. 

Mrs. Schooling's taveling 
companions were her sisters-
in-law, Mrs. Flossy Griggs and 
Mrs. Ida Griggs, both of Clo-
vis. 

ing's brother and sister-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Archie Griggs. 
Then in Phoenix, Ariz., a stop-
over was made in the home of 
another brother and his family, 
Mr. and Mrs. B.C. Griggs and 
children. 

The group visited in Tucson 
with Mrs. Schooling's nephew 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Griggs and daughter. On the 
return trip home, a brief stay 
was made in Alamogordo 
where other relatives were 
visited. 

The 15th Annual Convention 
of the Caprock District of 
Texas Federation of Women's 
Clubs was conducted at the 
Hilton Inn in Lubbock March 
15 and 16 with the Farwell 
Study Club being represented. 
Theme of the convention was 

Hear America Singing. —
Two hundred, sixty-five women 
registered on Friday and more 
were in attendance on Satur-
day, bringing the total to a re-
cord breaking registration. 

President Mrs. Harold Green 
opened the meeting and the 
convention delegation was wel-
comed by the Honorable Roy 
Bass of Lubbock. Reports were 
given, showing much activity 
and interest. Projects for the 
year included Poll Power, 
Girl's Town, Community Im-
provement, Public Affairs, 
MIA and other things of need. 
Special emphasis had been 
placed on Girl's Town. 

Dr. B.J. Humble of Abilene 
Christian College was speaker 
for the dinner meeting. "God 
Bless America" was his sub-
ject. 

According to Mrs. Carrie 
Christian of the local cltib, 
Saturday was a day filled with 
inspiration. "The Junior Clubs 
of the District entertained, as-
sisted with the meeting, and 
gave reports of their work. 

A style show of garments 
made by members of both 
clubs was followed by a lunch-
eon. The invitation to meet in 
Plainview in 1976 was given 
and accepted. Theme for the 
coming year will be "Growing 
Through Unity." 

The Farwell clubs' yearbook 
was submitted for judging and 
was awarded second place. 

Those attending the conven-
tion from Farwell were Mrs. 

In Las Cruces, N.M., the 
group visited with Mrs. School- 

The "real" suit returns to 
fashion this year in a most 
important way. This 
trimly-tailored outfit by Patty 
O'Neil is a dress-and-jacket 
ensemble with the look of 
three-piece. The floral, pow-tied 
blouse is seamed and belted to 
a flippy, four-gore skirt and 
covered by a matching jacket 
with definite Forties' overtones 
Made in a frosted heather 
fabric blend of "Dacron'.  
polyester and Du Pont nylon. 
it's a smashing spring-into• 
summer design. 

"SPRING" 

INTO THE 

EASTER PARADE 

A 

COMPLETE 

FASHION 

SELECTION 

READY FOR 

YOU! 

eticia battweEtt er, 
BankAmericard 	master charge 	0 
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DISPLAY 

AND READY 

TO PLANT! 

SHADE 
AND FRUIT 

TREES 

This Week We Are Celebrating DeKalb 

Seed Days. Many Items Throughout Store 

Specially Marked For This Occasion. 

Guthals Company Inc. 
"Ours Are Better" 

1001 E. First St 	 Clovis, N.M. 
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At Monday Meeting - 

Texico Woman's Club Discusses 
Plans For State Convention 

Mrs. Jewel Scott, Mrs. Car-
rie Christian and Mrs. Loucile 
Foster, all of Farwell, were in 
Lubbock March 15 and 16 to 
attend the annual convention of 
the Caprock District of the 
Texas Federation of Women's 
Clubs. 

While in Lubbock, the wo-
men were guests in the home 
of Mrs. Grace Jones, sister-in-
law of Mrs. Christian. Mrs. 
Jones recently moved from 
Farwell to Lubbock. 

SS** • 

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Parr of 
Farwell over the weekend 
were Parr's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Parr of Childress. 
Accompanying the Parrs was 
their grandson, Brent Isbell, 
also of Childress. 

project and the recipe book 
project. More recipes are 
needed for the book, and Marie 
Christian and Marcia Leavell, 
chairman, may be contacted 
for information. 

Other items of business in-
cluded discussion on plans for 
the city park, the Business For 
Beauty project and the Shell 
Oil Co. programs. 

Hostesses for the meeting 
were Teresa Curry and Aileen 
Teel. Table decorations carried 
out an Easter theme and re-
freshments of finger sand-
wiches, cookies, punch and 
coffee were served. 

Eleven members of the 
Texico Woman's Club were 
present for that group's meet-
ing Monday, March 17, at 7 
p.m. at the Texico Community 
Building. 

A spring and summer fash-
ion show had been scheduled 
for the program, but was re-
scheduled for the meeting on 
April 21 at 7 p.m. MDT at the 
Texico Community Building. 
Hostesses for the April meet-
ing will be Bettie Martin and 
Chris Billingsley. 

During the business meeting, 
preparations for the New 
Mexico State Federation of 
Women's Clubs convention 

Kim Magness Selected 
For 'Who's Who' 

Mr. and Mrs. Troy Christian 
of the Oklahoma Lane com-
munity were in Amarillo Sun-
day visiting with Christian's 
sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Benny Darnell and child-
ren. 

were discussed. The conven-
tion will be held in Clovis in 
April. Members of the Texico 
and the Melrose Woman's 
Clubs will serve as hostesses 
for a social during the conven-
tion on April 17. 

Members of the club served 
as judges for the bicentennial 
essay contest, sponsored by the 
club. Winners were selected, 
with three entries going to 
state competition. Although the 
winners' names cannot be 
divulged prior to state judging, 
one winner was selected in Di-
vision III and two winners 
were selected in Division II. 
No entries were submitted in 
Division I. A total of nine 
entries was submitted. 

Entries were judged on ori-
ginality and presentation of 
subject matter, according to 
Texico Woman's Club presi-
dent, Marie Christian. 

Reports were also given on 
the progress of the safety 

Son Is Born To 
**SS* 

Kim Magness, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Magness of 
Farwell, recently received not-
ification that she has been se-
lected for inclusion in the 
Ninth Annual Edition of 
"Who's Who Among American 

JUNE WEDDING PLANNED — Mr. and Mrs. I. W. (Dutch) 
Quickel of Farwell announce the engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter, Teresa Ann, to Lt. Dale Dickman, 
United States Air Force, son of Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Dick-
man of Virginia Beach, Va. The couple will exchange vows in 
June in Baumholder, Germany. The bride-elect, a graduate of 
Farwell High School, is currently serving as a school 
instructor in Germany where she plans to continue for another 
year. 

41111111110. Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Westphal of Far-
well for the past week have 
been Mrs. Westphal's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Kass from 
Howard City, Mich. The Kas-
ses left Farwell Monday, March 
17, to begin their return home. 

***** 

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hugh Preston of 
Farwell over the weekend 
were four of their grandchild-
ren, Marilyn and Mike May of 
Sudan and LaDon and David 

Perrys Host House Guests 

Carl Kirklands 
Parents Of Son 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Kirkland 

of Farwell are parents of their 
first child, a son born Sunday, 
Mar. 16, at 10:22 p.m. in the 
Friona hospital. 

The newborn has been 
named Brandon Don and 
weighed 7 lbs., 10 oz., and was 
20 inches long at birth. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne Winkles 
and paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Kirkland, 
all of Farwell. 

Great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. O.L. Winkles, Rev. 
and Mrs. Glen Lethgo, Mr. and 
Mrs. A.W. Green, all of Clovis, 
and Mrs. Della Kirkland of 
Amarillo. 

Guests in the home of Rev 
and Mrs. W.T. Perry Thur:. 
day, March 13, were Col. Moy-
ers Shore of San Jon and his 
granddaughter, Miss Stacy 
Shore of Denver, Colo. 

The Shores were guests of 
the Perrys for the Farwell 
Chamber of Commerce ban-
quet held Thursday night, 
March 13. The guests left Fri-
day morning, March 14. 

Delton Wilhites 
Have Second Son 

Sheree Rundell Participating 
In WT Intership, Conference 

For credit, pay and working refer them to books and arti-
experience, six students in- Iles relating to their job field 
eluding a former Farwell High and sometimes assign them 
School graduate work at parti- some office work to help 	  
cipating businesses as part of 	them." 
the Office Administration In-
ternship and Conference 
course of the School of Busi-
ness at West Texas State Uni-
versity in Canyon. 
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KIM MAGNESS 

Terri Edwards 
Is Named To 
Dean's List 

High School Students, 1974-75." 
The 17-year-old Farwell High 

School junior is a member of 
the National Honor Society, 
annual staff and pep club. For 
the past three years, she has 
been manager for the Varsity 
and Junior Varsity Steerette 
basketball teams. 

Kim is active in youth work 
at Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church where she is 
pianist for Sunday evening 
worship service. 

Main hobby of the student is 
playing the piano. She also en-
joys swimming and reading. 

Following her graduation 
from high school, Kim plans to 
further her education at Mc-
Murry College in Abilene 
where she hopes to major in 
eduation. 

Selection to "Who's Who" is 
a nationally recognized honor, 
awarded to juniors and seniors 
who have demonstrated lead-
ership in either academics, 
athletics, extra-curricular ac-
tivities or community service. 
Recommendations are receiv-
ed from every category or or-
ganization involved with stud-
ents, including high schools, 
churches, scholarship agen-
cies, civic and service clubs 
and youth program sponsors at 
the national and local levels. 

While the number of students 
selected annually varies from 
school to school, on a national 
basis, less than four percept of 
the junior and senior class 
students are featured in the 
publication each year. 

Objectives of the program 
include giving the. student work 
experience to coordinate with 
her training and a chance to 
broaden her education, work-
ing under the supervision of 
qualified business people, she 
explained. 

"It gives the student a 
chance to see what kind of a 
job they can get. The program 
really aids the community, 
also, because it gives them a 
chance to get the good stu-
dents." 

Students submit periodic re-
ports and employers fill out 
appraisal reports including 
comments about job know-
ledge, work quality and per-
sonal characteristics. 

Mrs. McCall requires one 
project per semester related to 
the student's job. 

"If the student's job is par-
ticularly demanding, I don't 
require a project," Mrs. Mc-
Call said. 
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THE FASHION SHOP 
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Mr. and Mrs. Delton Wilhite 
of the Oklahoma Lane Com-
munity are parents of their 
second son who has been 
named Dustin Eli, born at 7:07 
p.m. Thursday, Mar. 13, in the 
Muleshoe hospital. 

The new son weighed 6 lbs., 
14 ozs., and measured 20 
inches in length. He has one 
brother, Lonnie Paul, two 
years old. 

Maternal grandmother is 
Mrs. Virginia Winegeart of 
Oklahoma Lane and paternal 
grandmother is Mrs. Emma 
Lue Wilhite of the West Camp 
Community. 

Paternal great-grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. H.W. Her-
ington of West Camp and 
maternal great-grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. E.L. King of 
Wellington and Mrs. Vetrus 
Winegeart of Texico. 

E. Winegearts 
Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Wine-

geart of the Oklahoma Lane 
Community are parents of a 
son born Thursday, Mar. 13, at 
6:30 p.m. in the Muleshoe hos-
pital. 

The new arrival has been 
named Paul Edward and is the 
first child for the couple. He 
weighed 7 lbs., 8 oz., and is 20 
inches long. 

Paternal grandmother is 
Mrs. Virginia Winegeart of 
Oklahoma Lane and maternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
John W. Beam of San Antonio. 

Great-grandparents are 
Mrs. Vetrus Winegeart of Tex-
ico, Mr. and Mrs. E.L. King of 
Wellington, John W. Beam Sr. 
of San Antonio and Mrs. Mc-
Elhoe of Pennsylvania. 

In Shuman 
Home e 

Visiting home of Mrs. 

in th   

Hope Shuman of Farwell last 
week were her sister, Joyce 
Heath of Chillicothe, Tex., and 
her daughter and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. George Williams and 
son Chris of El Reno, Okla. 

Other friends and relatives 
in the Shuman home last week 
were Mrs. Dora Shipp of 
Chillicothe; Mr. and Mrs. 
Horace Campbell of Frederick, 
Okla.; Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Wilkinson of Vernon, Tex.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Walt Shuman Jr. of 
Amarillo; Mrs. Walt Shuman 
Sr. of Lovington, N. M.; Mrs. 
Zola Shunian and Mrs. Maydell 
Brooks, both of Farmington, N. 
M.; and ''Louise Hadaway of 
Belen, N. M. 

Marriage Licensep 

Parmer County Clerk's Of-
fice issued two marriage li-
cense during the past week. 

The licenses were issued to 
Kenneth Leroy Pryor and 
Gwendolyn Otekah New-
brough; and Roscoe William 
Parr and Laverna W. Brock. 

Therese Edwards of Farwell, 
daughter of Mrs. Marilyn Ed-
wards, has been named to the 
Dean's Honor List for the 1974 
fall semester at Texas Chris-
tian University. 

To be eligible for this honor, 
students must be enrolled for a 
at least 12 semester hours' 
credit. For that work freshmen 
must have achieved a 3.4 or 
higher grade-point average, 
sophomores a 3.5 gpa, juniors 
a 3.6 gpa and seniors a 3.7 or 
above average. 

A total of.  687 students were 
named to the TCU lists for the 
fall semester. Three hundred 
sixty-three of those were from 
AddRan College of Arts and 
Sciences, 125 from the School 
of Fine Arts, 65 from the M.J. 
Neeley School of Business, 69 

The course, which has been from Harris College of Nursing 
in existence for five years, can and 65 from the School of Edu- 
be repeated once for credit. 	cation. 

Open House Honors 
. 	• Vtrginta Winegeart 
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Mrs.Virginia Winegeart was 	Special guests were Mrs. 
honored with an Open House Winegeart's parents, Mr. and 
Sunday, March 16, in her new Mrs. E.L. King of Wellington, 
home located one mile west of Tex., and her sister, Mary 
the Oklahoma Lane cross- Ruth Jones of Quail, Tex. 
roads. 	 Hostesses for the occasion 

Approximately 65 persons were Mmes. Johnnie Rundell, 
atteded the come and go Open Billy Sides, David White, R.E. 
House. Persons attending were Blankenship and Vernon Sym-
served refreshments of punch, cox. 
coffee, assorted cookies and 

Among the students partici-
pating in the program are 
Sheree Rundell, daughter of 
Mrs. Johnnie Rundell of Far-
well. A four-year secretarial 
studies major, Sheree works as 
secretary for the WT Methodist 
Student Center. The Farwell 
senior plans to continue secre-
tarial work after graduation. 

Other students included in 
the program are Kathy Acker, 
Canyon senior; Kathryn Manz, 
Canyon senior; Mary Hasse, 
Pampa senior; Kathleen Huse-
man, Amarillo senior; and 
Kathy Langford, Littlefield 
sophomore. 

The students, not necessarily 
office administration majors, 
need the consent of the in-' 
structor to take the course. 

To earn three hours credit, 
the students are required to 
work 180 clock hours in pre-
arranged operational activities 
in a designated business enter-
prise, Mrs. Willie S. McCall, 
assistant professor in office 
administration, said. 

The 28 businesses partici-
pating in the program are 
located in Canyon, Amarillo, 
Claude, Dalhart, Follett, Pam-
pa, Lubbock, Midland and 
West Texas State University. 

Although no classes are in-
volved in the program, con-
ferences are arranged between 
Mrs. McCall and the student. 

"I usually visit the girl three 
times during the semester and 
see how she's getting along in 
her job. Sometimes I talk with 
the employer to find out where 
she needs help," Mrs. McCall 
said. 

"If they need assistance, I 

breads from a table covered 
with a cutwork cloth displaying 
a candle-floral centerpiece. 

In Poland it was once believed 
that on Christmas Eve the 
heavens part to reveal Jacob's 
ladder 
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&kV Vail 
stripes up the band 
Tiny dots sprinkled the two-part way. Short-stop top 

snugs over its own swingskirt. Big white buttons, 

boldly-banded midriff, puff sleeves. Vicky Vaughn 

makes it carefree in polyester double knit, machine 

washable dryable. Black or Brown with White. 

1 
/lb Alit _ &lib 

YOUR DEPARTMENT SIn 

CLOVIS. NEW MEXICO 88101 

520 MAIN 

Preston of Lubbock. 

Visiting in the home of Rev. 
and Mrs. W. T. Perry of 
Farwell Sunday were their 
daughter and son-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Hargrave and 
baby daughter, Brandi, of 
Lubbock. The Hargraves spent 
the day with the Perrys and 
returned to Lubbock Sunday 
evening. 

***** 

Mr. and Mrs. David Hall, 
Bobbi and Kerri of Texico 
were in Earth Friday and 
Saturday visiting in the home 
of Mrs. Hall's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Robbins. 

••••• 

Visiting in the home of Mrs. 
B. N. Graham of Farwell 
Sunday, Mar. 16, were her 
granddaughter, Kathy Gra-
ham, and Kathy's fiance, Mike 
Chauveaux, both of Lubbock. 

***** 

Mr. and Mrs. Pershing Bus• 
bice and Katie Busbice, all of 
Farwell, traveled to Fort 
Worth the weekend of March 
8-10 to visit with the Busbice's 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Billington and 
Kelly. They also visited briefly 
with Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Traxson and Stephanie while 
there. 
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Lovely dresses for Easter. 

for you from Lucille's. Choose a soft 
)lyester blend, a crisp voile-look, or 

a swinging gored skirt topped with a' 
perky jacket. You'll find the look 

that gets a second look at 
Lucilles Smart Shop 

HILLTOP PLAZA 	 762-7750 



30% - 40% - 50% On Some! 
STUFFED EASTER 
TOYS - 20% Off 

NEW FOR EASTER 20% Off 
LADIES & GIRLS DRESSES 

New Shipment Farwell Steer 
Windbreakers 20% Off 

Brand New Shipment Of Mens 
Straw Hats 20% Off 

All Kiddies Sweaters 1/2 Price 

Blankets - Pillows 
Mattress Pads 20% Off 

Levis - Nacona Boots 
Resistol Hats 20% Off 
Womens Dresses And Slack Suits 

30% Off 
Mens Shirts - 20% Off 

Dress - Sports - Western 50% Off 

HOLIDAY 
THE FAMILY STORE 

Store Hours 9-6 	FARWELL 	Ph. 481-9070 

STOREWIDE 
20% DISCOUNT 

CORN SEED 

AVAILABLE 

WE HAVE SOME WEATHERMASTER 
EPX 11 and SX 91 

and 999 Seed with 90-95% Germ. 
Some 1914 Yields Were Above 12,000 lb. 

In The Farwell Area 

INTERSTATE 
FERTILIZER 

FARWELL — TEXAS 

CARL'S 
OXON 

SERVICE 
STATION 

Carl Matthews, Mgr. 

All Brands Oil Wash 

& Lube Tire Service 

Accessories Batteries 

Good Service 

25 Yrs. 
Experience 

Ph. 
481-9082 

500 Ave. A - Farwell 
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By SWCD 

Charles Hough Is Honored As 'Outstanding COOS811W18011 Farmer' 
by Herb Evans 
Soil Conservationist 

OUTSTANDING CONSERVATIONIST - Charles Hough of the 
Hub community was named "Outstanding Conservation 
Farmer" of Parmer County for 1974 by the Soil Conservation 
Service. Hough, who farms south of Friona, is shown with a 
portion of his irrigation equipment which aids him in his 
farming operation and is also a conservation measure 
employed by the outstanding conservation farmer. 

CAPTIVATION -- Edwin Stephenson, a 64-year-oid retired engineer and father of Mrs. Pudge 
(Pat) Rose of Farwell, belongs in his own special way to children, especially the 37 students 
in Mrs. Kathy Weems' kindergarten class at Farwell. Stephenson, a resident of Ft. Worth, is 
in Farwell visiting with his daughter's family and sharing his spare time with the students. 
"He has a special talent for getting knowledge across to children," commented Mrs. Weems. 
The attention the children give to Stephenson can be seen as he instructs five of the students 
during a geography session. 

During 1974, many people 
learned of his operation. The 
Soil Conservation Service and 
the Agriculture Research Ser-
vice have both toured his farm 
and studied his results. The 
Progressive Farmer Magazine 
has interviewed him and has 
upcoming features about him. 
The Southwestern Farm Press 
interviewed him and featured 
him and his operation in their 
November 28, 1974 issue. He 
has become a prophet of things 
to come. 

In an interview Charles list-
ed these results of his convert-
ed operation: he has a $17,000 
saving on labor and he has re-
duced his tractor fuel con-
sumption from 6000 gallons per 
year to 1950 gallons per year. 
In addition, his fuel for irriga-
tion is about one-half that of 
his neighbors. This is energy 
conservation. 

Neighbors are taking a 
second look, then paying him 
the ultimate compliment. They 
are starting to copy him. 

Charles Hough of the Hub 
community was the outstand-
ing conservation farmer of 
Parmer County in 1974. Charles 
grew up in a conservation-ori-
ented family. His father, Spen-
cer Hough, became a coopera-
tor with the Parmer County 
SWCD in 1950. This was at the 
time irrigation was first being 
developed seriously in the 
county. The Houghs depended 
heavily on the district for as-
sistance in developing an irri-
gation system. 

Charles, who is now 34, 
learned at an early age that 
the district could be trusted 
and depended upon to give 
sound and valuable assistance. 

The outstanding farmer took 
over the entire operation of the 
farm in 1962. It is now 
genuinely a family operation. 
With the able help of his wife, 
Luann, 9-year-old son, David, 
and 12-year-old daughter, Dor- 
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Edwin Stephenson - - 

'Grandfather' To 37 Kindergarten Students 

By ACS  
Cancer Quiz Leaflet Will Be Circulated 

by Linda Mast 

the leaflet to be distributed this 
year by the more than 2.3 mil-
lion ACS volunteers. 

"Quiz yourself, and then help 
yourself with a checkup and 
others with a check. We want 
to wipe out cancer in your life-
time," said Mrs. Hughes. 

asked Mrs. Hughes quoting the 
leaflet. "Is it knowing the 
Seven Warnint, Signals of can-
cer, jogging or taking multi-
vitamins?" 

If you don't know what the 
Seven Warning Signals are, 
they're listed on the back of 

'A Cancer Quiz - for every 
family' featuring lifesaving 
answers, is the theme of the 
American Cancer Society's 
new leaflet to be circulated in 
40,000,000 homes during its 1975 
educational and fund-raising 
Crusade," declared Mrs. Gwen 
Hughes, Farwell Crusade 
Chairman. 

"If you know the correct 
answers to the 10 questions you 
are in a good position to help 
protect yourself and your fam-
ily," she said. "Then pass it on 
to a friend or relative." 

All of the questions relate to 
vital information about breast 
cancer, cancer of the cervix 
and other major sites, as well 
as cigarette smoking and 
health checkups. 

"What is your best everyday 
protection against cancer?" 

NEW FIND IS 3,600 YEARS OLD 

is, Charles has been able to do 
all the farming operation with 
no outside labor since 1973. 

Charles and his father had 
known for years that, even 
with the most careful irriga-
tion water usage, water and 
soil were being lost with a 
furrow irrigation system. In an 
attempt to save irrigation 
water, Charles installed two 
tailwater recovery systems. 
This helped reduce water 
wastage, but the soil erosion 
was not helped and water was 
still begin lost through percola-
tion. Coupled with this, Charles 
was making in excess of 15 
tractor trips across his land 
per year. These were his 
standard operating procedures. 
No matter how inefficient they 
were, they were the best the 
technological community had 
to offer. 

At least one full time farm 
employee had to be hired to 
help Charles perform the work 
in a timely manner. This was 
expensive because experienced 
employees demand premium 
wages and fringe benefits in 
Parmer County. 

Late in 1971, Charles lost his 
employee and was unable to 
obtain additional hired help. 
He managed to survive that 
year and the 1972 crop year 
with the help of a neighbor. 

In the fall of 1972, bad wea-
ther began and continued until 
planting time in the spring 
1973. There was no chance for 
seedbed preparation before 
planting. As a result the crop 
was planted directly in heavy 
residues. Charles had no op-
portunity to farm the "normal 
way," the way he was used to. 

When the crops were har-
vested he was in for a shock. 
The yields were not signifi-
cantly different from previous 
years and his operating ex-
penses were very significantly 
different. Net profits soared. 

The only problem he en-
countered was how to irrigate 
in the furrows through the 
heavy residues. However, he 
kept thinking of the other ex-
penses that were alleviated. 

He took his problem to the 
district. After an intensive and 
comprehensive study he was 
given several alternative solu-
tions. Charles decided a series 
of center pivot automatic 
sprinkler systems would re-
duce his irrigation water wast-
age and would permit him to 
have a minimum number of 
tillage operations with no 
water application problems. 

The heavy residues would 
also serve a double purpose. 
Soil erosion from both wind 
and water would be minimal 
and the shading effect of the 
residues would reduce soil 
water evaporation. 

He has not kept his success a 
secret. He has shown his 
neighbors what can be done 
and kept other interested 
parties informed. 

In Central Lebanon, a 
group of archaeology students 
from the American University 
of Beirut has discovered arti-
facts 3,600 years old. These 
students have unearthed such 
items as pottery, painted 
bowls, bronze arrowheads, 
rods and needles. The most 
significant find unearthed 
during these excavations have 
been a bronze bowl which 
dates back to 1600 B.C., and 
the Middle Bronze Age burial 

site of an infant and five 
adults which was discovered 
at a depth of about 21 feet. 

"We're glad we do got Mr. 
Stephenson to visit with us and 
show and tell us things,-  says 
Emmitt Autrey, five-year-old 
Farwell kindergarten student 
and son of Mr. and Mrs. Em-
mitt Autrey of Farwell. 

Talking to the Farwell kind-
ergarten students, one has the 
impression that the Mr. Steph-
enson of whom Emmitt is 
speaking belongs entirely to 
the youngsters in that class. 
Fortunately this is not the case 
as Edwin Stephenson, 64-year-

' old retired engineer and father 
of Mrs, Pudge Pat) Rose of 
Farwell, belongs in his own 
special way to all children. 

The 37 kindergarten students 
of Kathy Weems began to feel 
this way about Stephenson 
when his granddaughter, Teresa 
Rose, of that class decided to 
take him to her school last No-
vember as her -show and tell" 
project. As it turned out 
granddad Tlid some show and 
tell of his own on things like 
animals and stories that the 
children liked. He made such a 
hit with the youngsters that 
Mrs. Weems encouraged him 
to return whenever possible. 

Since that time, whenever he 
is visiting with his daughter's 
family, the Pudge Roses, in 
Farwell, he makes a special 
effort to visit with and bring or 
share something special with 
the kindergarten class. His 
first major get-acquainted ef-
fort was to bring a set of slides 
to the children from the Fort 
Worth Zoo where he does 
volunteer work. 

"As he showed the slides." 
commented Mrs. Weems, "he 
beautifully described the ani-
mals and explained how they 
lived in the wild." She added, 
"He has a special talent for 
getting knowledge across to 
children." 

Through the efforts of 
Stephenson, the Farwell kin-
dergarten class was able to 
obtain a permanent set of 
these slides for future students 
to enjoy. He has also taped a 
narrative to accompany the 
slides. 

Other activities that Mr. 
Stephenson does in the kinder-
garten classroom include story 
reading, nature studies, craft 
demonstrations and tour guid-
ing. Folk art and lore, which 
are known by many old timers, 
are his speciality. For instance 
the children were delighted 
when he taught them how to 
make music by blowing 
through a comb. Recently he 
escorted the class on a visit to 
a museum in Portales. 

Snuff it Out! 
The rise in male cancer 

deaths is due largely to the in-
creasing rate of lung cancer-
14 times greater than 40 years 
ago. Do yourself a favor-drop 
the cigarette habit, says the 
American Cancer Society. 

and hospitals offer many 
opportunities to serve as a 
docent, story teller, and as just 
a friend to others," said 
Stephenson. 

Stephenson's philosophy of 
life can be found in these 
words from one of his favorite 
Bible verses, "more blessed to 
give than receive." 

"I guess you could say that 
lately I've been imposing on 
the retired people and others 
who have much to give in the 
Farwell community by monop-
olizing so much time with the 
kindergarten youngsters of this 
town," stresses Stephenson. 

He goes on to explain, "Most 
of us before retirement are 
busy seeking monetary com-
pensation to raise families. 
But, as we retire, we are faced 
with an ample supply of time 
in which we are no longer 
required to do necessary 
chores for economic reasons. 
We are able, instead, to do 
more social work that compen-
sates just by serving, that we 
were too busy to do when we 
were younger. 

"I recommend that everyone 
read Dr. Paul Tournier's book, 
'Learn to Grow Old.' Old age is 
something that needs to be 
planned for as a 'next ca-
reer'," says Stephenson. 

In conclusion, Stephenson 
offers this challenge to retired 
persons in Farwell': 

"If you feel that life is 
passing you by, then maybe it 
is. Get out and do something to 
help others. Give of yourself to 
your community in active 
service and your rewards will 
be great and unmeasurable. 
You're needed, especially by 
the children who can use your 
life experiences and wisdom to 
enhance their view of the 
world they live in." 

students could grasp the medi-
cal situation. He hoped his 
example of recovery would in-
spire them. 

On a more elementary level, 
he repeated these demonstra-
tions to the kindergarten class. 
"He told us about the operation 
and how he tried to help scared 
people who were sick like him 
in the hospital." commented 
little Shonda Foster of the 
kindergarten class. 

Stephenson, with his wife, 
makes his home in Fort Worth 
where, after retirement, he 
began to search for active, 
purposeful social involvement 
rather that opting for days of 
"golf and rocking chair ease.- 

"I retired in June of 1973 
after a long and rewarding 
career as a construction and 
maintenance engineer for the 
federal government," stated 
Stephenson. "Used to an active 
career as the regional con-
struction and maintenance en-
gineer of the Fort Worth office 
for a five-state area, it would 
have been impossible in retire-
ment for me to set on my duff 
and let time eat me up. 

"My first search for an 
opportunity to serve led to 
reading for the blind at the 
Tarrant Junior College in Fort 
Worth. I taped various texts 
for use of the blind," related 
Stephenson. 

• "But I was not satisfied with 
just this effort so I answered 
an ad in the newspaper 
requesting docents (unpaid 
lecturers) for the Fort Worth 
Zoo. A group of retirees and 
others, along with myself, re-
sponded to the ad. Our job is to 
take tour groups through the 
zoo and explain about the ani-
mals, especially first grade 
children's groups in the fall. 
We also give slide presenta-
tions and take small animals 
such as lion cubs, snakes and 
hamsters to elementary sci-
ence classes in the Fort Worth 
public schools. 

"When I fully recover from 
my recent operation, I will be 
returning to my duties as 
docent at the zoo and will be 
searching for other beneficial 
volunteer work that I can do. 
The Fort Worth public schools 

The charm of Stephenson is 
in his technique of gentle yet 
disciplined approach to young-
sters. His story telling ability 
in conjunction with the grand-
fatherly image that he pro-
jects, keeps their attention and 
interest. "He is a little like my 
grandfather, and he works in 
the zoo; that's why he's special 
to me,-  states Joe Bass, 
another of Mrs. Weems' stu-
dents. 

An unexpected opportunity to 
remain longer in Farwell came 
in February when Stephenson 
underwent open heart surgery 
in Lubbock. It was also a 
chance for the kindergarten 
children to express their love 
and need for this man. 

Each student constructed a 
"get well" card with the help 
of an adult aide. Mrs. Weems 
then mailed the parcel of cards 
to Mr. Stephenson at the 
hospital. 

One message simply said, 
"It's time to get well" and 
another read, "Hope you get 
well soon as you are a kind 
man and interesting, and a 
sweet man!" 

"Dad's spirits were greatly 
lifted when he read those 
simple messages of concern 
and good wishes from those 
little fellows," expressed his 
daughter Pat. "He had to 
answer each one and mail the 
package of replies back to the 
class." 

Not stopping there, Stephen-
son shared his crayons and 
construction paper left over 
from making the reply cards 
with a 10-year-girl who had 
been his roommate in intensive 
care. Later he was to receive a 
personally designed card from 
her when he returned to 
Farwell. 

While recuperating from the 
operation in the hospital, he 
tried to cheer others who were 
awaiting a similar operation 
by explaining the techniques of 
the surgery and showing how 
well he was doing after 
surgery. 

Being out of the hospital and 
back in Farwell for only one 
day, he nevertheless visited 
Farwell Junior High for Public 
School Week. When he dis- 
covered that the sixth grade 
class (6B) was studying sci-
ence and health, he visited the 
class and described his illness 
and its cure to the students. 

By using graphs and prints 
describing his heart condition, 
he explained the "by-pass" 
operation that had been neces-
sary to restore proper circula-
tion to and from his heart. 

Stephenson said that he even 
showed the scar, so the 

\-- E Q0 
SALES 	,0  
AND 

SERVICE 
Ph. 481-3212 

LL 	FARWELL, T EXAS 	0 

MM 
POWER PLANTS 	TRACTORS 

SO\lc,\nSakS 	 SCFli,qtZ311/1/Eti 
s\-\P\l 	TYE 	si LOD ER:c  

B\--P 	DRILLS 	̀40ES 
DISC BEDDERS 

HAMBY 

TOOL BARS 

ROD WEEDERS 

HESSTON 
SWATHERS 

MOVERS 
STACHANDS 



Thursday, March 27. 19)5 

1.00 Case 1 
2:15 Cam 2 
3,30 Case 3 
4,45 Cauca A 
6,00 Case I 
7.15 C4A4 4 
A.30 Casa 5 

Casa 6 
Case 7 
Case 
Case C 
C... 0 
Case 9 
Case 10 

100 
2,15 
3;30 
4:45 
6.00 
7:15 
6.20 

COMM') SCHEDULE or CAMS 

rotes. March 2$, 1975 Saturday, March 29. 1975 

9,00 a.m. CA41.4 F 
10,15 a.s. Case 11 

3.00 p.m. Case C 

7,15 p.s. Cast 12 
4.20 p.a. Cass M 

a 

ILWILEIAL 104101442447 

TT-IA1 
KEA r ..q 

UWE DEMO \ 

lesceabastacre 

L4 

HAT CSPan COMMUNITY SHELTER 
PLANNING - TELLS PEOPLE 
IN THE COMMUNITY WHERE 
TO GO AND WHAT TO DO IN 

-(14.1 THE EVENT OF AN ATTACK 

MORE FACTS? 
WRITE OR CALL YOUR 
LOCAL CIVIL DEFENSE 

A Quality Product Of 
THE 

ASK YOUR LOCAL DEALER OR CONTACT 	COM Pit N I' 
Plainview Texas 79072 
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First, Fifth - - 
Seventh Yearlings Place In Two Meets 

Super Girls Team - - 

Kathy Booth Selected 

`Sophomore Of Year' 
Farwell Steerette Kathy 

Booth has been selected "Soph-
omore of the Year" and was 
named to the Panhandle Plains 
Super Girls' Basketball Team 
by the sports writers of the 
Amarillo News-Globe. 

Kathy, a sophomore Steer-
ette and daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Toby Booth, was describ-
ed by the team selection com-
mittee as "already an unusu-
ally dangerous all-around play-
er with moves, quickness and a 
shooting ability from all over 

the court that usually are seen 
in seniors. She averaged 23 
points, 3.5 rebounds and • five 
assists. She shot 47.5 percent 
from the field and 75.9 from 
the line. She is considered the 
most talented girls' basketball 
player ever to play for Far-
well." 

Kathy has played under the 
direction of Coach Gayle Nich-
olas during her two years as a 
member of the Varsity Steer-
ette squad. 

Sharon Booth 
Leads Scoring 

SOPHOMORE OF YEAR --
Steerette Kathy Booth, daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Toby 
Booth, has been tagged "Soph-
omore of the Year" and was 
named to the Panhandle Plains 
Super Girls' Basketball Team 
by the sports writers of the 
Amarillo News-Globe. "She is 
considered the most talented 
girls' basketball player ever to 
play for Farwell," stated 
members of the team selection 
committee. 

For West Team 
Sharon Booth, senior Varsity 

Steerette and daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Toby Booth of Far-
well, was a competitor in the 
Fifth Annual Golden Spread 
East-West All-Star Basketball 
Game and was tagged high 
individual scorer for the West 
All-Stars. 

Although the West team was 
downed 67-41 in the competi-
tion Saturday, March 15, Sha-
ron led the scoring attack for 
the team as she canned a total 
of 17 individual points. 

placed fourth with a time of 
55.1. Team members are 
James Castleberry, Benny 
Yruegas, Mark Owen and 
Blaine Buchenau. 

The mile relay team, Castle-
berry, Bruce Kaltwasser, Ow-
en and Yruegas, placed with a 
time of 4:45.8. 

Other members of the Year-
ling track team are Michael 
Boling, Larry McDorman, Cly-
de Bibbs, Richard Winegeart, 
John Sullivan, Teddy Mesman, 
Tommy Mesman, William 
Mlrtin, Keith Martin, Brent 
Black and Alan Warren. 

Yearling Coach Jerry Owen 
commented, "Our boys have a 
real good attitude. They are 
serious toward meets. At Olton 
we didn't settle down but 
during the Friona meet, they 
were real serious and did what 
they were capable of doing to 
take the meet." 

Next meet for the 7th 
Yearlings will be Saturday, 
March 22, at Springlake-Earth. 
Preliminaries are to begin at 9 
a.m. with finals scheduled at 
1:30 p.m. 

t-, — 	- 	-  
There's a word for the fear 
of the number thirteen. It's 
triskaidekaphobia, from the 
Greek, of course. 

Field events competition in 
the high jump was led by 
Powell who topped the cross 
bar at 4'8". Buchenau led in 
long jump action with a 
distance of 15'7" and Castle-
berry placed fifth in the event 
with 13'9". 

In the shot put, Yruegas 
placed third with a throw of 
31'8". Yruegas topped discus 
competition with a measure-
ment of 109' with Yearling 
Troy Coleman taking fifth in 
the event with 88'. 

Prior to the Friona meet, the 
Yearlings participated in a 
meet at Olton and were 
awarded fifth place. Taking 
first at the meet was Aber-
nathy with 143; second, Olton, 
113; third, Littlefield; 68; 
fourth, Springlake-Earth, 58; 
fifth, Farwell, 56; with Idalou 
Amherst and Friona also en-
tering. 

In finals competition, Year-
ling Buchenau took fourth in 
the long jump, 15'7", third in 
the 220-yard dash, 25.5, and 
placed in the 100-yard dash, 
11.4. 

Yruegas was awarded fifth 
in shot put, 30'2", fourth in 
discus, 82'1012", and second in 
the high hurdles, 19.5. 

Powell took sixth in the high 
jump, 4'6", and third in the 
high hurdles, 21.1. 

The Yearling 440-relay team 

The 7th Yearling track team 
of Farwell entered two track 
meets recently with the Year-
lings bringing home a first 
place and a fifth place in 
competition. 

The Yearlings earned the 
first place trophy at the Friona 
Invitational Track Meet con-
ducted Friday, March 14. 
Farwell led with 113 points 
followed by Friona with 107, 
Littlefield, Dimmitt, Morton 
and Hart. 

In finals competition in 
running events, the sprint re-
lay team from Farwell placed 
second with a time of 52.2. 
Members of the relay team are 
Steve Powell, Benny Yruegas, 
Mark Owen and Blaine Buche-
nau. 

Yearling Bruce Kaltwasser 
placed fourth in the 880-yard 
dash with a time of 2:48.2. In 
the 60-yard high hurdles first 
place was taken by Yruegas, 
9.4, and third went to Owen, 
10.3. 

The 100-yard low hurdles 
competition saw Yruegas take 
first place honors with a time 
of 19.1 and Owen, fourth, with 
20.1. 

The 880-yard relay team 
came in fifth in competition. 
Team members include James 
Castleberry, Bruce Kaltwas-
ser, Steve Powell and Ruben 
Miranda. 

8th Yearlings Place Fourth 

In Olton, Friona Track Meets 

ALL-STAR TEAM -- The 1975 All-Star Team for the Farwell Little Dribblers was selected last 
week. This team will be traveling to Bovina March 27, 28 and 29 to compete in the Regional 
Tournament. Members of the Farwell All-Stars are, left to right, front row: Brent Green, 
Gary White, Blake Buchenau, Boyd White and Todd Meeks; back row: Randy Herington, 
Skipper Waller, Richard Carpenter, Byron Mayfield and John Scott. Serving as coach for the 
team will be Johnny Actkinson with Vernon Scott acting as assistant coach. 

4E4 	 

Little Dribblers End 
Regular Season Play 

The final games of the re-
gular season for the 1975 ses-
sion of Little Dribblers have 

I ." been played and scores re-
: leased for the games. 

Games scores are as follows: 

Farwell's 8th Grade Yearling 
track team was entered in 
competition in two track meets 
recently. The tracksters tra-
veled to Olton Feb. 28 where 
they placed fourth. March 14 
the Yearlings participated in 
the Friona track meet and a-
gain took fourth place. 

At the Olton meet, the Year-
ling 440-yard relay team took 
first place honors with a time 
of 51.0. Team members are 
Radney Robertson, DeeDee 
Foster, Steve Owen and Gary 
Lee. The mile relay team, 
composed of Foster, Robert-
son, Mario Vidaurri and Row-
dy Chandler, came in second in 
that event with a time of 
4:19.0. 

In individual competition, 
Owen placed second, Joe Cas-
tillo, third, and Chandler, sixth 
in pole vaulting. 

Lee captured third place in 
the 100-yard dash, 11.3, and 
third in the 220-yard dash, 26.0. 
Robert Lucio placed fifth in the 
880-yard dash and Bruce May- 

field placed sixth in the event. 

With a time of 51.0 the 440-
yard relay team of Farwell 
took third place at the Friona 
meet. The 880-yard relay team 
came in fourth with a time of 
1:49. 

Individually, Lee took fourth 
in the 100-yard dash with 11.3, 
Robertson was fourth in the 
440-yard dash at 60.1, and Rick 
Coleman took fifth in the dis-
cuss and fifth in the shot put. 

In hurdles competition, Owen 
placed first in the 60-yard high 
hurdles with a time of 9.0. 
Chandler came in third in the 
100-yard low hurdles with 13.4. 

Other Yearlings participat-
ing in the track program are 
Rance Williams, Mike Rodri-
quez, David Hernandez, Steve 
Scott, Robin Roberts and 
Sammy Clines. Coach for the 
8th Yearlings is Larry McDor-
man. 

The team will be competing 
in the Springlake-Earth track 
meet Saturday, March 22. 

FIRST PLACE TRACKSTERS -- The 7th Grade Yearlings of Farwell entered competition at 
the Friona track meet Friday, March 14, and topped the field of competitors to bring home 
the first place trophy. Members of the track team are, from left, front row: Keith Martin, 
Brent Black, Bruce Kaltwasser, Ruben Miranda and Alan Warren; second row: Richard 
Winegeart, Blaine Buchenau, Steve Powell, Benny Yreugas, Mark Owen, James Castleberry 
and Larry McDorman; third row: Tommy Mesman, William Martin, Troy Coleman, Michael 
Boling, Clyde Bibbs, John Sullivan and Teddy Mesman. Coach for the Yearlings is Jerry Dee 
Owen. 

8 Cougars (f) 4 
15 Cougars 17 
17 Pacers (f) 6 
36 Pacers 	18 
18 Pacers (f) 5 
21 Pacers 	37 
7 Cougars 10 

17 Cougars 10 
10 Nets (f) 	11 
16 Nets 	22 
10 Pacers (f) 10 

• Stars (f) 
Stars 
Nets (f) 
Nets 
Stars (f) 
Stars 
Nets (f) 

"...• Nets 
Stars (f) 
Stars 
Cougars (f) 

Cougars 	29 Pacers 	28 

In farm team action, the 
Nets topped the ladder at the 
end of play with a record of 7 
wins, 0 losses. Second were the 
Stars with 5 wins, 2 losses. 
Also in the farm team category 
were the Pacers, 1-6 and 1 tie, 
and the Stars, 1 tie game. 

In game action for the Cou-
gars, Stars, Nets and Pacers, 
the Cougars and Nets were tied 
at the end of the season with 
records of 6-1 each. The Stars 
and Pacers each had records 
of 1 win, 6 losses. 

By March 24 - - 

Farmers Urged To Return 

Census Of Agriculture Forms 

Counties Urged 
To Work On 
Bicentennial 
Counties should play an act-

ive role in planning and stag-
ing local observances for A-
merica's BiCentennial in 1976. 

According to Rod Kendig, a 
member of the National As-
sociation of Counties, "things 
must first happen at the local 
level." 

"Counties can establish citi-
zen committees to work on the 
BiCentennial, work with the 
school system to create an a-
wareness of county govern-
ment in the state of Texas, and 
work with the local historical 
society," said Kendig, who is 
based in Washington, D.C. 
"Committees can work on 
plantings and decorations for 
the courthouse grounds and 
other locations." 

Kendig said Hood, Gray and 
Randall counties have esta-
blished oral history projects 
which work with historical 
societies to record remini-
scences of the past. "Randall 
County is putting in a visitor 
center which will benefit that 
county's citizens for years to 
come," he said. 

"It is how we respond in the 
future that is going to make a 
difference in how citizens 
judge our county," said Ken-
dig. "America's BiCentennial 
celebration should begin, not 
end, in 1976." 
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PTO RODWEEDER 

recognizing the American 
farmer on National Agriculture 
Day and suggests that no more 
fitting day than March 24 can 
be found for returning report 
forms not yet mailed back to 
the Bureau. Enclosed with the 
Bureau's reminder letter will 
be a second report form in 
case the original has been lost 
or mislaid. 

Bureau officials say that col-
lection of census data cannot 
be phased out until every re-
port form is accounted for. 
Late reporting adds to the cost 
of the census and delays pub-
ication of census results. 

*The unique drive sleeve 
insures longer trouble- 

free operation 
eliminating U-joints 

American farmers are being 
- urged to do themselves a favor 
on the right kind of day, the 

• ,
,
Bureau of the Census says. 

March 24 is mail-out day for 
;sending letters from the Bu-

'A-eau to farm operators who 
.have not yet returned their 
:completed report forms for the 
:1974 Census of Agriculture. 

It's also American Agricul-
ture Day, an occasion spon-
sored by the National Agri-
:Marketing Association 
,(NAMA). The purpose of Na-
tional Agriculture Day is to 

.call attention to all Americans, 

.urban and rural alike, to the 
.:contributions of agricultural 
yroducers to the well being of 
-the nation. Agriculture is the 
..nation's biggest, most basic in-
dustry, and NAMA's theme for 

;the occasion is "Almost every-
-thing starts on the farm." 

The Bureau (part of the U.S. 
:Department of Commerce's 
',Social and Economic Statistics 
.::Administration) joins NAMA in 

* Standard single chain 
& new double chain 

models are oil-lubricated 
to prolong life of chain 

& sprockets 

In West Africa it's believed 
that thunder causes lizard 
eggs to hatch. 

*The adjustable shank mount 
bracket allows better alignment 
of rod & bearings. Adapts 
to V4  e9( 3" shanks 

* Bed knives are optional 
& are recommended for 

double chain models 

"Rhyme Of The Ancient Water Heater" 

Water, Water etlergAere 
jincS not a drop to drink; 
Rub none to bathe anb none to Wash. 
Chere's something Wrong, 3 think. 
Our ancient Water heater, 
jt burst at 3a.m. 
Che signs of strain an6 stress, 

never thought to check for them. 
So first thing in the morning 

remotle this albatross. 
:11n electric Water heater 
Will dletffate 	loss! 5-2 1131 

ir 	 ' 	Y. 	AF fmmiMM. 	'ROW 'MOW\ P. —.MOW .MMIW 

*A heavy duty 14N drive line is standard on all 197 2 models 

*All bearings are triple sealed for durability and long life 

WE SELL, SERVICE, INSTALL, 

FINANCE & GUARANTEE 

tutvans-it n mum WM 

gAlrhP 
11F  RIEWIMIff 
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ELECTRIC 
Water Heaters 

A/6 
ELECTRIC 

71/ea4q 

WE SELL 'EM - C.-Ca  LJSI 

SEE 
IOW • • • 

OUR STORE FULL 
OF FURNITURE VALUES 

DURING OUR 1316 

SPRING FURNITURE. 
SALE 

4 	FRED SHIPLEY FURNITURE CO. 
763-7534 	Clovis, N.M.' 	163-4431 

in% mu tuna 

FARWELL EQUIPMENT CO. 
P. 0. BOX 648 

FARWELL, TEXAS 79325 

c X 3.-C X. X -X.. -PC. -PC XXXXXXX X-1-CXXYXXX  The Future IS Electric! 

90 Days - No Interest 

fOlint OPP( f 	T 	1I'IOYI 19  



INSULATE FOR COMFORT 
AND ECONOMY 

Farwell Builders 
Supply 

/481-9998  
109 - 1st 	Farwell 

Boyd's Complete 

Brake And Bear 
Front End Service 

TIRE TRUING, WHEEL 
BALANCING AND OVER-
LOAD SPRINGS, MONRO-
MATIC SHOCKS, DRUM 

TURNING, BRAKE 
DRUMS, BRAKE SHOE 
EXCH. POWER BRAKES, 
ELECTRIC BRAKES IN-
STALLED. 

BankAmericard And 
master charge Welcome 

Boyd's 
Brake Shop 

2 Blks. off Main St. Leave 
Car Here and Do Your 
Shopping 	1-tfnc 

WELL CASING -- 16 in. 1 4  in. 
wall. New, $9.95 per foot. Far- 
well Pipe and Iron, Farwell, 
481-3287. 	 23-tfnc 

REDUCE safe & fast with 
Gobese Tablets & E-Vap "Wa- 
ter pills". Rose Drug. 	27-3tp 

FOR RENT -- Furnished a-
partment, bills paid. Inquire 
221 Anderson, Texico. 	27-1tc 

ATTENTION — If you are in-
terested in buying a new or 
used car or pickup at whole-
sale prices, call Bob Fillpot. 
Day, 505-769-1901, Night, 806- 
238-1645. 	 25-5tp 

FOR SALE — 3 bdrm., 2 bath 
house in Bovina. Good location. 
Priced under appraisal. Ph. 
806/238-1231. 	 2&-4tc 

Atm 
SELL IN NEARBY FARWELL AND 
BOVINA AND MAKE SOME MONEY. 
Meet new people selling quality 
products. Interested? Call: 

481-342g 	27-3tc 

.i. 4  - 
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1 CLOVIS ELECTRONICS I , 

1440 MAIN 1 
CROWN ELECTRIC 

Electric Motor Sales 
Browning Power Trans. 

2nd and Oak 
Clovis, N. Mex. 

CO. 
& Serv. 

Eq. FABRIC 

Better 
HILLTOP 

Better 
MART 
Fabrics 

Make 
Fashions 

PLAZA 

AUCTION SALES 

Thurs. 	7:30 P.M. 
MENNELL'S AUCTION 

1011 	E. 2nd 	- 	762-2581 n‘l  it  2.,  . 4:, 	Ssticirokp  
.•  
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i 	Infants and 
Maternity 

Wear  
1312 Main 763-7145 

Vacuum Sales & Service 
KIRBY CO. OF CLOVIS 
Lawrence Riggins, Dist. 

313 W. Yucca 	Clovis, N.M. 
I 	Ph. 763-4798 

Free Home Demonstration 

1814 West 7th 

CA11 
All 

ROTHWELL 
(Behind 

AUTO 
163-3530 

BODY 
ALSO 

Chief's 

For 
REPAIR 

GLASS 

BODY 
Fee 
Automotive) 

Estimate 

WORK 

SHOP 

& REPAINTING 
On 
Clovis, N.M. 

KODAK 
BELL & HOWELL 

fo93 MIRANDA 	 , 
MINOLTA 

POLAROID 
ROLLEIFLEX 

CANON 	PROMPT DEVELOPING 	 a 
PENTAX 	SERVICE — 	 * 
KONICAALL SIZES FILM — 	, •-,;-.-.. 	5 

-. —s." 
MAMIYA/SEKOR 

LARGE 	 on 	.,,, I 
SAWYER 	 SELECTION 

PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

611 Main 	Clovis 	Ph. 763-3834 

• •••••••••••ohor 
	

•. ••%. 	 - 	 % 

TELEX. 
HEARING AIDS 

CLOVIS HEARING AID CENTER 
* Batteries * Molds * Free Hearing Tests 

SERVICE ALL MAKES 
416 Mitchell 	 Pho. 763-6900 

• •••••••••.• • " 	• • • • • • • •• • • ••••••••• • ••• . • • • 64 r••••0,4 II • .04 •*%.4 	4,4 • 	414 4/4/./....."4/4 	 NN 

J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY 

904 Third Street Box 621 

Farwell, Texas 
Ph. 4813288 or 

505/163-5575 Unit 5408 

OFFICE HOURS 
Monday - Friday, 10 a.m. to 6 p.m. 

Saturday, by appointment. 

WE NEED FARM' 
LISTINGS NOW 

NOTICE 
HOME LOAN MONEY 

NOW AVAILABLE 
THIS WEEK'S SPECIAL 

ifiu A. Irrigated. 3 miles southeast of Farwell. 

320 A. Dryl 
wheat, 13 go 

rfect, beautiful 
a. 

pearl 
eiLuf 

Good 300 A. irrigated and well improved. 4 miles 
east of Farwell. 

** ***** *** 

93 A. irrigated, lays good. 4 miles southeast of 
Farwell. 

Nice 3 bdrm. stucco house in Bovina. 
***** *0*** 

160 A. irrigated, well improved in Bailey County. 

280 A. irrigated, well improved in Bailey County. 

2 bdrm. house eor, 	moved. Priced to 
sell. 

Large steel building, concrete floor. Ideal for 
commerical or storage. Good location. 

Lariat -- 3 bdrm., 2 bath, with garage. Extra nice 
and clean. Newly remodeled, fenced yard and 
extra large lots. Priced to sell. 

3 bedroom. 1 bath house fenced back yard, near 
school. 

NEED A FARM LOAN? CALL US 
.5.. *****►  

640 A. to settle estate. 280 A. farmland, balance 
grassland. 3 - 3 inch wells, west of Friona. Priced 
for immediate sale. 

.400*.triv:  

320 A. irrigat5 Ciilk,piVeast of Farwell. Has 
3 wells. 

280 A. with 5 wells. Well improved on highway, 5 
miles west of Muleshoe. 

Newly painted and carpeted 3 bedroom, 2 baths, 
stucco, with garage, fenced back yard and storage 
shed, nice location. 

* • * * * *►* 

2 bedroom, 1 bath, with carport, nice location. 
********* 

On highway, new spacious and lovely, 4 bedroom, 
31 . ,  baths brick home, double garage, on 3 acres. 
Lots of storage and extras. Near Bovina. 

****** * * * * 

2 bedroom with garage, good neighborhood. 
►*►*►* *►* 

240 A. irrigated, west of Muleshoe. Has 2 wells. 
Side roll sprinklers. 

.......... 

Good quarter 5)0dLf 	dryland, north of 
Bovina. 

760 A.. 5 wells. 2 houses. 2 quonsets. Rhea 
Community. 

******5*** 

3 bdrm.. 2 bath, extra nice and clean; has garage, 
storm shelter.,nice yard, good location. 

Small tracts: 1-10 A, 1-20 A, 1-44 A, all on Highway 
near Lariat. 

* * * * * • 41 

3 bdrm.. 3 bath brick, excellent location, lots of 
extras. 

* * ****** * 

Several good business locations: With railroad 
access of Amarillo Highway. 

* 	* *5* * * * 

LEARN TO SKATE. BUY A SKATING RINK IN 
FARWELL. 

* WE NEED LISTINGS NOW * 
"Sales and Loans Are Our Service" 

SALES STAFF 

J. B. Sudderth 
Peggy Sudderth 
Gerald Curtis 

481-3288 
481-3288 
481-3887 

Mary Bryant 
Glenn Marsh 
Sarah Marsh 

481-9322 
481-9108 
481-9108 
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ATTENTION 

CATTLEMEN 
in the 

TEXICO-FARWELL AREA: 

Your local 
,used cow 
dealer is 

friona bi-products 

Seven days a week 

stock removal 

CALL COUICT 247-3032 

Aura 
I HAVE AN OPEN TERRITORY 
NEAR FAAWELL AND BOVINA. It 
can be yours. Excellent earnings. Call: 

481-3428 	27-3tc 

'EMSOMEttEUMMEMOSIEMOSINEMSSM 

CLASSIFIED ADS 
KIMMINNIINMEMONS88888NESSMESMSMI 

legal Notices 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF PARMER 
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE 
PRESENTS: 

FIREWOOD FOR SALE: By 
the ton, or by the cord. Oak. 
split wood, pinon, juniper, 
cedar and mesquite. W-J Auc-
tion, 108 Pile St., Clovis. 

31-tfnc 
THAT the Commissioners 

Court of Parmer County, 
Texas, has determined in its 
discretion that it is advisable 
to make a lease or leases for 
mineral development of County 
School Lands belonging to 
Parmer County, Texas, situat-
ed in Gaines County, Texas, 
and such Commissioners Court 
does hereby give notice of its 
intention to lease the following 
descirbed land for such pur-
pose; to-wit: 

All of the interests in 
and to the oil, gas and 
other hydrocarbons in 
and under; and that 
may be produced from 
Labors 1, 2, the E/2 of 
3, the E/2 of 8; All of 

Labors 9, 12, and E/2 
of 13, S/2 of 16, S/2 of 
17, the E/2 and SW/4 
of 18, and All of Labors 
23, 24, and 25, League 
317, Parmer Co. School 
Lands, Gaines Co., 
Texas 

The Commissioners Court of 
Parmer County, Texas, will 
receive and consider bids for 
such mineral lease as such 
Court may determine to make 
at the next regular term of 
such Court to be held at or 
after 10:00 o'clock A.M. of the 
second Monday in April, 1975; 
that is, the 14th day of April, 
1975, at the Court House of 
Parmer County, Texas, in 
Farwell, Texas. On said date 
and at said place the Commis-
sioners Court of Parmer Coun-
ty, Texas, will receive by Pub-
lic Auction and consider upon 
public hearing any and all bids 
submitted for the leasing of 
said lands as hereinabove 
described and in the discretion 
of such Court will award the 
lease to the highest and best 

Texico-Farwell Alcoholics A-
nonymous meets Wednesdays, 
8:30 p.m., Security State Bank 
public room. For help, call 
481-9070 or 481-9330. 	22-tfnc 

CARD OF THANKS 

We wish to express our 
thanks for the love and con-
cern and for all the acts of 
kindness shown us during the 
long illness and death of our 
beloved Pat. Thank you espec-
ially for the memorials, the 
prayers and the food and 
cards. And our special thanks 
to all the nurses on 2-C at 
Memorial Hospital. May God 
bless you all. 

Henry Haseloff, 
Mark and Joe 
Robert and Cyndi Haseloff 
Mrs. Hope Shuman 

bidder submitting a bid there-
for provided that if, in the 
judgment of such Court, the 
bids submitted do not repre-
sent the fair value of such 
leases, such Court in its dis-
cretion may reject same and 
again give notice and call for 
additional bids. The form of 
lease to be awarded pursuant 
to the successful bid is exhib-
ited with the Resolution of such 
Court providing for receipt of 
such bids adopted on the 10th 
day of March, 1975, and may 
be inspected in the Office of 
the Clerk of said Court. 

WITNESS OUR HANDS and 
the Seal of said Court at Far-
well, Texas, this 10th day of 
March, 1975. 

THE COMMISSIONERS 
COURT OF PARMER 
COUNTY, TEXAS 
James P. Fortenberry, 
County Judge, Parmer 
County, Texas 

ATTEST: 
Bonnie Warren, County Clerk 
Parmer County, Texas 

TAILI"ATER PITS CLEANED 
-- Also, front end loader and 
dump truck work. Bill Mumme, 
806/797-4957, Lubbock. 	25-4tp 

SEAL 

B & R REFRIGERATION — 
We specialize in electrical, air 
conditioning and refrigeration 
work. 24 hour service on 
service work. Bob White, 
Portales, N.M., 505/356-3682. 

26-4tp 

SPINET ORGAN, Automatic 
Rhythm, Chording & Bass. 
Must relocate. Individual with 
good credit may assume bal-
ance in small monthly pay-
ments. Write Credit Mgr., Box 
3192, Lubbock, TX 79410. 26-2tc 

Published in the State Line 
Tribune Mar. 14, 21, 28, 1975. 

801 Pile St. 

762-4417 
NOTICE TO BIDDERS Gum mOuSAG 

LENDER 

Clovis, New Mexico Fceuvell 
Filet 'Baptist Clock 

Cliff Ennen - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

• 

TWO MINUTES ,  
WrOl THE BIBLE 
BY CORNELIUS R. STAM PRES. 

BEREAN BIBLE SOCIETY 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 606.33 

Oltilakma fae 
13aptig. awirk 

Robert J. Roberts - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

ROSE DRUG 

1? GIFT SHOP 

Prescriptions a Specialty 
481-3281 

OKLAHOMA LANE 

FARM SUPPLY AND GIN 

"Where Your Business 
Is Appreciated" 

Actoewbbi 06 Gad 
James Alexander - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:30 p.m. 

WATTS 

Machine and Pump 
Layne Bowler Pumps and 
Repair - Gearhead Repair 
Ph. 481-3239 - Farwell, Tex. 

MINN 	WUXI 

Lou's 
Beauty Salon 

Katie and Mae 

Ph. 481-3262 

FARWEL1 EQUIP. CO. 

Phone 481-3212 

TEXACO 

INC. 

Woodrow Lovelace 

Ooeley 
10 414 

6.4**11, 

STATE LINE 

OFFICE SUPPLY 
Ph 481-9235 

105 3rd - Farwell 

IMPORTANT DOCUMENTS 
COPIED FREE 

W & J AUCTION 
108 Pile St. Pho. PO 3-7311 

SALE EVERY TUESDAY 

James Priest & Associates 
Auctioneers 

/HOLIDAY/ 

5th & Ave. A - 481-9070 

Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Nance 

JOHNSON 

ABSTRACT 

COMPANY 
481-3878 

203 Ave G - Box 88 
Farwell, Texas 

Proposals for the construc-
tion of foundation for the 
Football Bleachers will be 
received by the Board of 
Trustees of the Farwell Inde-
pendent School District until 
8:00 p.m. Monday, April 7, 
1975, at the Superintendent's 
office. 

Bids will be received for 
construction of foundation. 

The Owner reserves the right 
to reject any or all bids and to 
waive all formalities. 

Plans and Specifications 
may be procured from W. M. 
Roberts, Superintendent of 
Schools, Farwell, Texas. 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

Proposals for moving the 
Football Bleachers from their 
present location to their new 
location at the new stadium 
site will be received by the 
Board of Trustees of the Far-
well Independent School Dis-
trict until 8:00 p.m. Monday, 
April 7, 1975, at the Superin-
tendent's office. 

Bids will be received for 
moving the Bleachers to the 
new site. 

The Owner reserves the right 
to reject any or all bids and to 
waive all formalities. 

Plans and Specifications 
may be procured from W. M. 
Roberts, Superintendent of 
Schools, Farwell, Texas. 

Published in the State Line 
Tribune March 14, 21, 1975.„  

CLOVIS SHOPPING DIRECTORY 

ti SE 7890112 

NEW EQUIPMENT 
1 - New JD 4630 Tractor, 

Cab, Air, Heat. 

1 - New JD 4430 Tractor, 
Loaded. 

USED EQUIPMENT 
1 - Used JD 4430 Tractor, 

Cab, Air, New Rubber, 
800 hrs. 

1 - Used 1974 GMC Truck, 
327, 20,00 mi. 

2 - #200 JD Stack Wagons, 
w/power tail gate. 

1 - 20 ft. Oneway plow. 
2 - 01610 Drills w/large 

Box 
1 - 14 Ft. Windrower, 

w/Cab & Air 
2 - JD 0148 Front End 

Loader 
2 - 11 Shank Chisel Plows 
2 - 25 F't. Chisel Plows 
2 - JD 0220 - 21 ft. Double 

Offset Disc Plow 

"We Trade" 

CAL JORDAN 
IMPLEMENTS 

Ph. 163-5511 

101 S. Walnut-Clovis N.M. 

A 

The conversion of Saul of Tarsus 

was an amazing event. Saul loathed the 

very name of Christ. He blasphemed 

Him and caused others to be tortured 

so as to compel them to blaspheme 

that holy name. He led his nation and 

the world in rebellion against the resur-

rected Christ — the world which had 

already disowned and crucified the 

lowly Jesus. 

But as Saul went to Damascus, still 

"breathing out threatenings and slaugh-

ter against the disciples of the Lord," 

(Acts 9:1) God did a wonderful thing. 

Rather than crush the leader of the 

world's rebellion, He saved him. Christ 

broke through the heavens, as it were, 

to speak words of love and pity to His 

greatest enemy on earth. As a result 

Saul's rebellious spirit was broken and 

in one moment the pitiless persecutor 

became the docile, indeed the devoted 

follower of Christ. 

More than that. Saul of Tarsus, the 

persecutor, became Paul the Apostle. 

To him the glorified Lord committed 

"the dispensation of the grace of God" 

(Eph. 3:2) and "the gospel of the 

THE APOSTLE OF GRACE 

grace of God" (Acts 20:24). Now, he 

went everywhere proclaiming grace, 

telling men how God loved them, how 

Christ had come into the world and 

gone to Calvary to pay for man's sins 

so that believing sinners might be saved. 

The gospel of the grace of God, 

found in Paul's epistles, does not blame 

anyone for the death of Christ. Rather 

it presents the cross as good news. It 

declares that "we have redemption 

through His blood, THE FORGIVE-

NESS OF SINS ACCORDING TO THE 

RICHES OF HIS GRACE" (Eph. 1:7). 

It says that "God hath concluded all in 

unbelief THAT HE MIGHT HAVE 

MERCY UPON ALL" (Rom. 11:32) 

and that "WHERE SIN ABOUNDED, 

GRACE DID MUCH MORE ABOUND" 

(Rom. 5:21). 

How wonderful! By grace and 

through Christ's all-sufficient work of 

redemption, the vilest sinner may be-

lieve and rejoice in the consciousness 

of sins forgiven. As Paul said to the 

trembling jailor at Philippi: "Believe 

on the Lord Jesus Christ and thou 

shalt be saved" (Acts 16:31). 

CAPITOL FOODS 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON-PITMAN, 

INC. 

The 
CITIZENS BANK 

Texico Branch 
Complete Bank Service 

Member FDIC 

PAY and SAVE 
Quality 

Groceries & Service 

FARWELL 

Religious Music All 
Day Sunday On 

KZOL 
We Camp Baptist am& 
Glennn Harlin - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 1570 On Your Dial 

ALDRIDGE 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
AUTO-FIRE-CASUALTY 

402 3rd Ph 481-3361 

St. 9abepleo 

Caiiidit 
Chrysostom Partee - Priest 
Confession - Sunday, 9:30 a.m 
Sunday Mass - 10 a.m. 
Christian Doctrine after Mass 

Haw& Iiielftedai 

ifietkadig Cktmek 
W.T. Perry - Pastor 
Church School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:15 p.m. .  

Fautaff 
Clack Ob Claig 

James Wilbanks - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

Herman J. Schelter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 

Texiat Fitet Baptist auvult 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 1 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Church Training - 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Wor-
ship - 6:30 p.m. 

Olialutiga Lige 

Ciwiwk 
0' > D. Smith - Pastor 
S. day School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

?Ewald Rd 

Baptist Cltwick 
MDT 

Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 
a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

CaEvati Baptiot CkMck 
Carrell Watkins - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

United Pesdecabtaf Clock 
E.R. Lanham - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:30 p.m. 

brad 
Omit Ob Civuot 

Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

St gokio 

.Cliffieuut Clot& 
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Some people believe that a 
coffin nail will unlock the 
door to hell. 

THE LIGHT SIDE 
By Bob Anson 

Nitpicking is proofread-
ing a letter of resignation 
for grammar and style. 

He travels fastest who 
travels with small children 
in need of a restroom. 

***** 

Only trouble with owning 
a hideaway is that all your 
friends want to hideaway 
with you. 

Road sign in school 
zone: "Give our kids a 
brake." 

**SO* 

Give your pocketbook a 
"Brake" at Bob's TV. 

BOB'S TV 
FARWELL 

FREEZER PAC -21_65s. ity';p6  06  Re r  

FREEZER PAC z= s24 
CROW MEAT 
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called for. the following members of the • 
Board voted AYE: Orville Burnett, 
Wayne Clark. Gene Paul Jarman, 
Reaford Wenner. Elvis Powell; and the 
following voted NO: None. 

LEGAL 
NOTICES 

NOTICE OF HEARING 
TO 

APPROPRIATE PUBLIC WATERS 
OF THE 

STATE OF TEXAS 

Orville Burnett 
President, Board of Trustees 

ATTEST: 

Wayne Clark 
Secretary, Board of Trustees 

No. 3410 
Published in State Line Tribune March 
21. 1975. 

NOTICE OF 
CITY OFFICERS' ELECTION 

Notice is given that SANDERSON 
GROUP 

(R.J. SANDERSON, J.W. GAMMON. 
WAYNE CLARK AND JIM ROY 
DANIEL) 
c/o Charles F. Aycock 
Aldridge, Harding and Aycock 
Attorneys at Law 
P.O. Box 286 
Farwell, Texas 79325 

applicants, seek a permit from the Texas 
Water Rights Commission to construct 
and maintain a 4427 acre-foot capacity 
reservoir and dam on Running Water 
Draw, tributary White River, tributary 
Salt Fork, Brazos River, tributary Brazos 
River, Brazos, River Basin. also referred 
to as SCS Site No. 3, Running Water 
Draw Watershed Project, and to use the 
water impounded therein for the irriga-
tion of 2820 acres of applicant's land in 
Sections 56. 57. 58. 61. 62, 63, 64. 65. Kelly 
Subdivision. Block H. approximately 28 
miles east of Farwell and 4 miles east of 
Lazbuddle, Parmer County. Texas, all 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
CITY OF FARWELL 
TO THE RESIDENT QUALIFIED 
VOTERS OF THE CITY OF FARWELL, 
TEXAS: TAKE NOTICE that an election 
will be held on the 5th day of April, 1975 
in the City of Farwell, Texas, at the 
place, in the manner, and for the officials 
set forth in the attached copy of an order 
for City Officers' Election. duly adopted 
by the Mayor of said City on the 24th day 
of February. 1975. Said attached order 
for City Officers' Election being made a 
part of this notice for all intents and 
purposes. 

Mamie Jane Bowery 

being more fully set out in the applica-
tion. 

Station 29 + 00 on the centerline of the 
dam is S 68° 04' E. 9411 feet from the NW 
corner of Section 63, Block H of the Kelly 
SubdiVision. 

The total combined diversion rate IS 
9600 gpm (21.4 cfs) by means of 8 
portable putnps at: S 73° 36' E. 5490 feet 
from the NW corner of Section 63, Block 
H. Kelly Subdivision; S 73° 36' E. 8375 
feet from the aforesaid corner; S 73° 36' 
E. 8526 feet from the said corner; S 68° 
03' E. 9099 feet from the said corner; S 
01° 57' W. 2397 feet from said corner; S 
88° 23' E. 1071 feet from said corner; S 
73° 36' E, 5440 feet from said corner; S 
59° 23' E. 6067 feet from said corner; 

Application No. 3410 was accepted for 
filing by the Texas Water Rights Com-
mission on March 10, 1975 and a hearing 
thereon will be held by the Commission 
in the Stephen F. Austin State Office 
Building at Austin, Texas. on May 6. 1975 
at 10 o'clock a.m. Those opposing the 
granting of said application should file 
written protests with the Commission and 
the applicant at least five days prior to 
hearing date, giving their reasons 
therefor and such other information as is 
required by Commission Rule 305.2. Per-
sons desiring futher information in this 
regard may contact Ryan Petty, P.O. 
Box 13207, Austin, Texas 78711, Tele-
phone (512) 475-2711. 

Joe D. Carter. Chairman 
TEXAS WATER RIGHTS 
COMMISSION 

City Secretary 

ORDER FOR 
CITY OFFICERS' ELECTION 

Date: March 11, 1975 

(SEAL) 

Published In State Line Tribune March 
21. 28. 1975. 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
CITY OF FARWELL 

ONE-ACT PLAY CAST — Farwell's entry in the University Interscholastic League One-Act 
Play Contest Thursday, March 20, will be "Just Another Day" by Arthur Lovegrove, directed 
by Tom Adamson. Cast members are, from left, Terri Boling portraying Betty Willis, matron 
of honor; Charles Hargrove playing George Barclay, father of the bride; Pam Erwin as June 
Barclay, the bride; Lisa Kittrell as Janet Barclay, mother of the bride; and Charla Norton 
portraying Sylvia Merrin, bridesmaid. Stage crew for the production includes Karla Smart, 
student director; Billy Roberts, stage manager; Sharon Booth, Jacquelyn Langford and Kittie 
Warren, make-up. ELECTION ORDER AND NOTICE 

Courthouse 
Notes THE STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF PARMER 

Courthouse within the boundaries of the 
above named School District and said 
place of absentee voting shall remain 
open for at least eight hours on each day 
for absentee voting which is not a Satur-
day. a Sunday. or an official State holi-
day, beginning on the 20th day preceding 
the date of said election. Said place of 
voting shall remain open between the 
hours of 8:00 and 5:00 P.M. on each day 
for said absentee voting. 

5. The manner of holding said election 
shall be governed, as near as may be, by 
the Election Code of this State, and this 
Board of Trustees will furnish all neces-
sary ballots and other election supplies 
requisite to said election. 

6. Immediately after said election has 
been held, the officials holding the same 
shall return to the president of the Board 
of Trustees in a sealed envelope a copy of 
the returns, poll list and tally sheet for 
said election, and this set of election 
returns shall be used by the Board of 
Trustees in canvassing said election. 

Another copy of the return, poll list. 
and tally sheet of said election shall be 
delivered to the president of the Board of 
Trustees in an un-sealed envelope and 
this envelope shall be available in the of-
fice of the superintendent open to 
inspection by the public for 60 days from 
the date of the election. 

7. The presiding judge for said election 
shall return to District Clerk immediate-
ly after the votes have been counted the 
ballot box containing the voted ballots 
and all other election supplies and said 
ballot box shall be preserved and kept in 
accordance with the terms and provisions 
of the Texas Election Code. 

8. The Secretary of this Board of 
Trustees shall forthwith issue a notice of 
said election by posting copies of this 
order at three different places within the 
boundaries of said School District, which 
posting shall be done not less than 20 
days prior to. the date for said election. 

The above order being read, it was 
moved and seconded that the same do 
pass. Thereupon, the question being 
called for, the following members of the 
Board voted AYE: Gilbert Kaltwasser, 
R.J. Garner, Walter Hughes, Ted Mag-
ness. Charles Aycock, Billy Mayfield, 
Wilbert Kalbas; and the following voted 
NO: None. 

Gilbert Kaltwasser 
President, Board of Trustees 

ATTEST: 

Wilbert Kalbas 
Secretary. Board of Trustees 

Published in State Line Tribune March 
21. 1975. 

ELECTION ORDER AND NOTICE 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF PARMER 

TAKE DIVISION I PLAQUE — The Farwell High School Band participated in the UIL 
Concert Contest Tuesday, March 11, and received a Division I plaque in sight-reading and a H 
Division certificate in concert. "I feel the judges gave fair observations on all bands included. 
I want to congratulate the Farwell students on their hard work and discipline getting ready 
for the contest," stated band director Lynn Burton. Competing against Bovina, Friona, Dim-
mitt, Kress, Springlake-Earth and Petersburg were Farwell band members, left to right, 
front row: Wayde Stance11, George Garza, Gary Green, Mike Deel and Mike Woods; second 
row: Donnie Garner, Barbara Defoor, Joi Meeks, Sharon Booth and Paula Martin; third row: 
Karan Herington, Karroll Rhodes, Pam Mayfield and Ann Tims. 

I. Gil Patschke. in my capacity as 
Mayor of the City of Farwell, Texas. do 
hereby order that an election be held in 
said City on the 5th day of April, 1975. for 
the purpose of electing the following of-
ficials for said City: 

MAYOR 
Two Commissioners 

That In accordance with an order 
adopted by the City Commission of said 
City, said election shall be held at the 
following place In said City, and the 
following named persons are hereby ap-
pointed officers for said election. 

In Election Precinct No. 1, at City Hall 
Building, in said City, with Kay Hagler 
as Presiding Judge. and Wanda Walker 
as Alternate Presiding Judge, and said 
Presiding Judge shall appoint the neces-
sary clerks to assist him which shall not 
exceed two clerks. 

Janie Bowery is hereby appointed 
Clerk for absentee voting. The absentee 
voting for the above designated election 
shall be held at City Hall Building 
within said City and said place of 
absentee voting shall remain open for at 
least eight hours on each day for 
absentee voting which is not a Saturday, 
a Sunday, or an official State holiday, 
beginning on the 20th day and continuing 
through the 4th day preceding the date of 
said election. Said place of voting shall 
remain open between the hours of 8 a.m. 
and 5 p.m. on each day for said absentee 
voting. 

That said election shall be held in 
accordance with the Election Code of this 
State and only resident qualified voters 
of said city shall be eligible to vote at 
said election. 

That the City Secretary/Clerk shall 
give notice of said election by posting a 
copy of this order in each of the election 
precincts of said city, which posting shall 
be done not less than 30 days prior to 
date fixed for said election. 

That immediately after said election is 
held, the officers holding the same shall 
make returns of the result thereof to the 
Mayor of this city as required by the 
Election Code of this State. 

A copy of this order shall also serve as 
a writ of election which shall be delivered 
to the above appointed Presiding Judge. 
for said election. 

2. That all requests by candidates to 
have their names placed upon the ballot 
for the above mentioned election shall be 
in writing and signed by the candidate 
and filed with the secretary of the Board 
of Trustees at the superintendent's office 
not later than 30 days prior to the date of 
said election. 

All candidates shall file with said 
application the loyalty affidavit required 
by Art. 6.02 of the Election Code. 

The Secretary of this Board of Trustees 
shall post on the bulletin board in the 
building where the Board of Trustees 
meets the names of all candidates that 
have filed their applications in accor-
dance with the terms and provisions of 
this Order. and said Secretary shall 
otherwise comply with the terms and, 
provisions of Art. 13.32 of the Election 
Code. 

3. That said election shall be held at the 
following places. and the following 
named persons are hereby appointed of-
ficers for said election: 

(a) In Election precincts numbered 5 
at auditorium Building, in Laz-
buddle, Texas. In said School Dis-
trict. with Frank Hinkson Sr. as 
Presiding Judge and Don McDon-
ald and Bill Jennings, Clerks. 

The polls at the above designated 
polling places shall on election day be 
open from 7:00 o'clock a.m. to 7:00 
o'clock p.m. 

4. Mrs. Murrell Johns Is hereby ap-
pointed Clerk for absentee voting. The 
absentee voting for the above designated 
election shall be held at Superintendent's 
Office within the boundaries of the above 
named School District and said place of 
absentee voting shall remain open for at 
least eight hours on each day for ab-
sentee voting which is not a Saturday, a 
Sunday. or an official State holiday, be-
ginning on the 20th day and continuing 
through the 4th day preceding the date of 
said election. Said place of voting shall 
remain open between the hours of 8:00 
a.m. and 4:00 p.m. on each day for said 
absentee voting. The above described 
place for absentee voting is also the 
absentee Clerk's mailing address to 
which ballot applications and ballots 
voted by mail shall be sent. 

6. The manner of holding said election 
shall be governed, as nearly as may be. 
by the Election Code of this state, and 
this Board of Trustees will furnish all 
necessary ballots and other election 
supplies requisite to said election. 

7. Immediately after the votes have 
been counted. the officers holding said 
election shall make and deliver the 
returns of said election and perform all 
other duties as provided by the Election 
Code. 

8. The Board of Trustees shall give 
notice of said election, and this combined 
Election Order and Notice shall serve as 
Notice for said election. The President of 
the Board of Trustees is hereby 
authorized and instructed to post or 
cause to have posted said combined 
Election Order and Notice at three public 
places where notices are customarily 
posted In this school district, and said 
posting hsall be made at least 20 days 
before the date of said election. 

The President shall also cause a copy 
of this combined Election Order and 
Notice to be published one time in a 
newspaper of general circulation in the 
county where this school district is 
located. Said publication shall be not 
more than 30 days nor less than 10 days 
before the date of said election. 

It is further found and determined that 
in accordance with an order of the Board 
of Trustees, the Secretary posted written 
notice of the date, place and subject of 
this meeting on the bulletin board located 
in the central administrative office of this 
school district, a place convenient to the 
public. and said notice, having been so 
posted, remained posted for at least 72 
hours preceding the day of this meeting. 

It is further found and determined that 
in accordance with an order of the Board 
of Trustees, the Secretary furnished a 
notice of the date, place and subject of 
this meeting to the county clerk of Par-
mer County. Texas, the county in which 
most. if not all, of this school district's 
pupils reside. 

The above order being read, it was 
moved and seconded that the same do 
pass. Thereupon. the question being 

Gil Patschke 
Mayor 

Published in State Line Tribune March 
21, 1975. 

On this the 10 day of February. 1975. 
the Board of Trustees of Farwell In-
dependent School District convened in 
Regular session with the following mem-
bers present, to-wit: 

Gilbert Kaltwasser, President 
R.J. Garner 	 Walter Hughes 
Ted Magness 	 Charles Aycock 
Billy Mayfield 	 Wilbert Kalbas 
and the following absent: None constitut-
ing a quorum and among other proceed-
ings had by said Board of Trustees was 
the following: 

WHEREAS, the term of office of 
Charles Aycock and Waiter Hughes 
members of the Board of 'Trustees of this 
School District will expire on the first 
Saturday in April, 1975. said first Satur-
day being April 5, 1975, and on said date 
a trustee election will be held in said 
School District. 

WHEREAS, it is necessary for this 
Board to pass an order establishing the 
procedure for filing for and conducting 
said trustee election; 

THEREFORE. BE IT ORDERED BY 
THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF 
FARWELL INDEPENDENT SCHOOL 
DISTRICT: 

1. That an election be held in said 
School District on April 5, 1975, for the 
purpose of electing to the Board of 
Trustees of said School District* Two 
Trustees. 

2. That all requests by candidates to 
have their names placed upon the ballot 
for the above mentioned election shall be 
in writing and signed by the candidate 
and filed with the secretary of the Board 
of Trustees at the superintendent's office 
not later than 30 days prior to the date of 
said election. 

3. That said election shall be held at the 
following place and the following named 
persons are hereby appointed officers for 
said election: 

At County Courtroom, County Court-
house Building in Farwell. Texas, in said 
School District, with Albert Smith as 
Presiding Judge, and Mrs. Albert Smith, 
Clerk. 

4. Bonnie Warren is hereby appointed 
Clerk for absentee voting, and Mildred 
Erwin is hereby appointed Deputy Clerk 
for absentee voting. The absentee voting 
for the above designated election shall be 
held at County Clerk's Office, County 

On this the 10th day of February. 1975, 
the Board of Trustees of LAZBUDDIE 
Independent School District convened in 
regular session, open to the public, with 
the following members present, to-wit: 

Orville Burnett, President 
Wayne Clark 	Gene Paul Jarman 
Reaford Wenner 	 Elvis Powell 
and the following absent: L.M. Smith and 
Marvin Mimms, constituting a quorum 
and among other proceedings had by said 
Board of Trustees was the following: 

WHEREAS, the term of office of Rea-
ford Wenner and Orville Burnett mem-
bers of the Board of Trustees of this 
School District will expire on the first 
Saturday In April, 1975, said first Satur-
day being April 5, 1975. and on said date 
a trustee election will be held in said 
School District. 

WHEREAS, it is necessary for this 
Board to pass an order establishing the 
procedure for filing for and conducting 
said trustee election; 

THEREFORE, BE IT ORDERED BY 
THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF 
LAZBUDDIE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL 
DISTRICT: 

1. That an election be held in said 
School District on April 5, 1975, for the 
purpose of electing to the Board of 
Trustees of said School District Two 
• Trus tees . 

Down On The Farm 

The Big Nose-Count Begins 

Instrument report ending 
March 6, 1975, at County Clerk 
Office, Bonnie Warren, County 
Clerk. 

WD - Jewell Lindeman et al 
— W 1/2  Sec. 19, T512S; R5E - 2 
ac. out W'2 Sec. 18, T51/2S; R5E. 

WD - A.L. Glasscock, et al -
Wayne McClaran — lot 13 & 
W1 2  lot 12, Blk. 4, Ridgelea, 
Bovina. 

WD - Bertha Kaltwasser -
Walter Kaltwasser — und. 20 
ac. in SW/ Sec. 8, T15S; R2E. 

WD - Bertha Kaltwasser - 
Gilbert Kaltwasser 	und. 20 
ac. in NE1/4 Sec. 7, T15S; R2E. 

WD - Delbert Black - Ever-
ardo Arce, Jr. -- N1 /2  lot 23 & 
all lots 24 & 25, Blk. 38, Far-
well. 

WD - Ralph Broyles - James 
L. Pope — lots 1, 2, 3, Blk. 30, 
Friona. 

OGL - D.O. Williams, Est. - 
Frank M. Youngblood 	N12- 
SE 1 4  & SW1/4  SE1,4 Sec. 35 
T2N ; R1E. 

Instrument report ending 
March 13, 1975, in County Clerk 
Office, Bonnie Warren, County 
Clerk. 

WD - Jane Barclay Over-
street - State Electric & Me-
chanical, Inc. — lots 17 thru 26 
Blk. 23, Farwell. 

WD - William H. Danheim - 
Domingto Rubio — W 75' lots 1 
& 2, Blk 40, Farwell. 

WD - Clifford 0. Porter - Jay 
E. Beene — S 5' lot 10, all lot 11 
Blk. 5, Lakeview Add., Friona. 

WD - Paulette Smith - O.J. 
(Pete) Smith — W 73' lot 5, Blk. 
2, Staley Add., Friona. 

WD - Jon Mack Roden - John 
E. Bingham — lots 21, 22, Blk. 
22, Friona. 

WD - Lois Nelson Clark -
Lanham Hugh Nelson, et al —
und. 1/4  int, in 239 ac. out Sec. 
30, T4S; R4E & SW1/4 _Sec. 13, 
T7S; R2E. 

WD - Lois Nelson Clark -
Lanham Hugh Nelson, et al —
und. 1/4  int, in 239 ac. out Sec. 
30, T4S; R4E & SW1 4 Sec. 13, 
T7S; R2E. 

WD - B.M. Seales - Wayne & 
Larry Jesko 	SW1 4  Sec. 22, 
T11S; R3E. 

WD - Ray D. Fleming - John 
E. Bingham -- lot 45 & W 25' lot 
46 Blk. 2, Western Add., 
Friona. 

all over the world, and Europe 
had become dependent on U.S. 
grains. No other country was 
equal to the U.S. in wool pro-
duction — and only Australia 
and Argentina offered any sig-
nificant competition. 

Farm statistics also noted 
breakthroughs in irrigation 
and drainage, progress in the 
invention and manufacture of 
threshers, and even the intro-
duction of such new domestic 
animals as camels and cash-
mere goats. 

They also turned up valuable 
information about livestock 
diseases and insect damage, 
and better knowledge of 
weather conditions' effect on 
crops. 

The 20th century brought so 
many changes in American 
farming that before long a cen-
sus had to be taken every five 
years just to keep pace with ag-
ricultural growth. 

By 1960, for example, the U.S. 
had one-third fewer farmers 
than it did in 1940 — but farm 
output was up 50 percent. 

Today, real-life counterparts 
of Marshal Dillon no longer 
take the farm census. Now it's 
done by mail and every farm-
er's report is kept confidential 
by law. Laborious tabulations 
are no longer done by clerks 
but now are fed into electronic 
computers. 

Despite modern devices for 
speeding up the gigantic inven-
tory-taking of American farms, 
the job is still time-consuming. 
But it remains a reliable indi-
cator of where the nation 
stands and where it seems to 
be going. 

SOONER or 
LATER you'll buy 
a New or Used 

Car from 
O.B. GULLEY 

pounds or 378 million bushels. 
Also looming large in the na-

tion's harvest picture were 219 
million pounds of tobacco, 155 
million pounds of sugar, 123 
million bushels of oats, 108 mil-
lion bushels of potatoes, 85 mil-
lion bushels of wheat, and 36 
million pounds of wool. 

The first census — conducted 
by federal marshals and their 
assistants — didn't go over too 
well in some sections of the 
country. It seemed a lot of 
folks thought the census re-
sults were going to be used as 
a basis for raising taxes. 

By the second go-round in 
1850, questions were extended 
to cover the size and value of 
some 32 crops or farm prod-
ucts. Also of interest to the gov-
ernment was the value of 
homemade manufactures down 
on the farm. 

As America's agriculture ex-
panded, so did the number of 
census questions. The 1880 cen-
sus asked 108 questions and in 
1890 the number climbed to 
255. 

By 1900, the farm census had 
documented sweeping changes 
in the nation's social and eco-
nomic structure. Figures 
showed production of major 
farm commodities had out-
paced population growth. Be-
tween 1840 and 1870, produc-
tion of wheat, corn and cotton 
had quintupled. Between 1850 
and 1900, tobacco yields more 
than doubled and wine produc-
tion increased sevenfold. 

American cheese and Indian 
corn had begun to be exported 

Whether you're a Main Street 
merchant counting needles and 
pins or a conscientious individ-
ual readying New Year's resolu-
tions, January's the traditional 
time for taking inventory. 

This year, the National Cot-
ton Council notes, one of the 
biggest and most important 
nose-counting operations in all 
the land will be undertaken by 
America's farmers in coopera-
tion with Uncle Sam. The occa- 

) sion: the 20th agricultural cen-
sus in the nation's history. 

While farmers won't be asked 
to tot up the exact number of 
needles in every haystack on 
their farms, they will be asked 
to do some extensive nose-
counting that stops just short 
of the haystack. 

Questions on the census form 
— which incorporates sugges-
tions from farmers themselves 
— range all the way from the 
age and sex of hogs and sheep 
on the farm to the number of 
acres on which chemicals were 
applied. 

The census doesn't reflect 
any undue nosiness on the part 
of Uncle Sam, but it does indi-
cate the continuing importance 
of agriculture to the nation's 
well-being. Agriculturists say 
it's an essential apparatus for 
gauging the present condition 
of U.S. farming and determin-
ing the prognosis, for its future. 

Data collected in the census 
form the basis for USDA pro-
grams, federal and state legis-
lation, farm organization poli-
cies, and numerous services 
provided by colleges, business 
firms, manufacturers, and oth-
ers. 

Millions of acres of soil have 
been turned by farmers since 
the first census was taken in 
this country back in 1840. That 
was the year when Martin Van 
Buren was President and the 
United States was composed of 
just 26 states and the District 
of Columbia. 

Farming was the major oc-
cupation of the day, with 15 
million of the nation's 17 mil-
lion citizens living in rural 
areas. 

No one bothered to count the 
number of farms in existence 
back then — probably because 
they were the rule rather than 
the exception. Another reason 
may have been that farm folks 
that year were too busy har-
vesting crops — all of them by 
hand. 

Judging from 1840 statistics, 
apparently quite a few Ameri- 
cans were cotton-picking in 
those days. They plucked some 
791 million pounds of the fluffy 
fiber that was the mainstay of 
America's economy and the 
source of a thriving export 
business. 

Pound-wise, Indian corn was 
the biggest crop of all. It 
amounted to about 21.2 billion 
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Lubbock Show - - 

Randy Gulps Shows 

Reserve Grand Champ 

Deaf Smith REC Has 37th Annual Meeting 

RESERVE GRAND CHAMP -- 

At the conclusion of the 
meeting, manager Hull said, 
"It is by far the best year the 
Cooperative has ever experi-
enced. We had record sales 
and margins, served many 
new loads, and had better ser-
vice. We are looking forward 
to another good year with your 
support." 

Co. Commissioners 

Plan Regular Meet 
The Parmer County Com-

missioners Court will convene 
in regular session at 11 a.m. 
Monday, March 24. 

Included in the business 
meeting will be the presenta-
tion and approval of regular 
bills, discussion of final ac-
ceptance of Law Enforcement 
Center, report of progress of 
the transfer of monies to the 
county depository and an open 
discussion of the possible 
county landfills. 

Randy Genies, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Genies of Farwell, entered his lightweight Duroc in 
competition at the Southwest Junior Livestock Show in Lub-
bock and brought home honors as his Duroc was judged 
Reserve Grand Champion Barrow over all breeds. The barrow 
sold for $300.00 over floor price to Cruce Auctioneering Service 
of Plainview. Randy is a member of the Farwell 4-H Club. 
Shown with Randy and his barrow is Dr. T.D. Tanksley, show 
judge from Texas A&M University. 

Lingnaus Kin Trip - - 

tor's Report. Anthony told 
members that many electric 
cooperatives have asked con-
sumers to cut back in elec-
trical usage. This, however, is 
not true with the REC, com-
mented Anthony, "We have 
plenty of available electric 
power if we do not abuse this 
resource." 

He did point out that electric 
bills are increasing, primarily 
due to the "fuel adjustment 
charge." Although this is a 
term not common in the past, 
it has been included in the 
wholesale contract for some 
time. Anthony stated that the 
increase of this charge has re-
sulted in passing it on to con-
sumers, and would probably 
account for about 15 to 20 per-
cent of their total bills. 

However, Anthony reminded 
members that this charge a-
mounted to no gain for the 
Cooperative, nor the power 
supplier. He did report that in 
spite of rising fuel costs, local 
REC members are still buying 
electricity at almost 25 percent 
below the state average. An-
thony concluded, stating that 
record revenues of more than 
$3.7 million were reported in 
1974. 

Explorer Whitesides 
Wins Bronze Medal 

view. Randy's other barrow 
placed fourth in the medium- 
weight Duroc class. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Geries and a member of the 
Farwell 4-H Club. Lee Ann 
Williams of Farwell placed her 
heavyweight Duroc 11th. 

Lazbuddie 4-H and FFA 
members came through the 
day with several high placing 
barrows. Joe Dan Tarter had 
the second lightweight Duroc 
behind the Champion and the 
fifth heavyweight Chester 
White. Russell Windham show-
ed the second and fifth heavy-
weight Chester White. Mark 
Mimms exhibited the third 
heavyweight Poland China and 
Stan Treider placed 7th with 
his mediumweight Crossbred 
barrow. In the steer show Kent 
Winders placed 15th with his 
lightweight Crossbred. 

Accompanying the young-
sters to the show were: Mack 
Heald, Jerry Mathis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Scotty Windham, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Tarter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Elvis Powell, Don McDonald, 
Weldon Crim, Marvin Mimms, 
Pat Clark, LaMoin Williams, 
Donald Christian and Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Geries. 

This concluded the show, cir-
cuit for the 1975 Spring season. 
Several of these youngsters 
will be showing barrows this 
Fall in various parts of the 
state. 

mittee report, was Timmy 
Wilhelm's speech. He gave the 
speech which won him this 
year's "Government - In - Ac-
tion" Youth Tour. Pam Vea-
zey, other essay winner, was 
unable to attend. 

Call to order of business by 
Osborn Sloan, Cooperative 
president, was followed by the 
secretary's report and election 
of directors. 

Eldred Brown and Raymond 
Annen were re-elected over 
Danny Smith and Vincent 
Braddock for new three-year 
terms. Brown is a representa-
tive from Deaf Smith County. 
Annen is from Castro County. 

Serving as master of cere-
monies was Earnest Langley 
who introduced James Hull, 
Cooperative manager. Hull 
then introduced special guests, 
including former manager Leo 
Forrest of Amarillo. Pat Rob-
bins followed by introducing 
members of the Planning 
Committee and extending an 
invitation to all members to 
support their annual meeting 
and offer suggestions to the 
committee. 

A.W. Anthony, Jr., a mem-
ber of the Board of Directors, 
presented the Annual Direc-
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Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Lin-
gnau of Farwell were named 
winners of an all-expense paid 
trip to Mexico City at the 37th 
Annual Meeting of the Deaf 
Smith Rural Electric Coopera-
tive conducted March 1 in 
Hereford. The trip was offered 
by the Cooperative and the 
Lingnaus will take the six-day 
soujourn sometime during 
1975. 

The 1975 Annual Meeting was 
one of the largest ever in at-
tendance, according to Coop-
erative officials. A record 1,074 
people were served at the 
meeting. The Hereford Rotary 
Club catered the barbecue din-
ner. The club will use proceeds 
from the dinner in community 
service projects. 

In addition to the meal 
served during the meeting, 
$152,000.00 in capital credits 
were paid to REC members. 

This year's record attend-
ance could be attributed to op-
timum weather and the 38-
member Planning Committee. 
This committee, headed by 
Chairman Pat Robbins, has 
proven to be an asset to future 
annual meetings. 

Another part of the program, 
in addition to Robbins' com- 

Both 4-H and FFA members 
from throughout Parmer Coun-
ty finished the 1975 Spring 
show season by competing in 
the Southwest Junior Livestock 
Show in Lubbock, March 9-12, 
with Randy Geries showing the 
Reserve Grand Champion Bar-
row. Exhibiting their animals 
were: Kent Winders, Russell 
and Mike Windham, Johnny 
McDonald, Terri Lea Clark, 
Joe Dan Tarter, Kirk Crim, 
Danny and Mickey Powell, 
Stan Treider and Mark Mimms 
of Lazbuddie plus Lee Ann 
Williams, Randy Geries and 
Charles Christian of Farwell. 

Highlight of the show was 
Randy Geries winning Reserve 
Grand Champion Barrow over 
all breeds. Randy started his 
climb to the top by placing 
first in the lightweight Duroc 
class. In the breed champion 
drive, Dr. T.D. Tanksley, show 
judge, anmed his barrow 
Champion Duroc. 

Next came the final drive a-
gainst the other breed champ- 
ions. Dr. Tanksley used the 
Crossbred barrow for Grand 
Champion, and came back to 
Randy's Duroc for Reserve 
Grand. These two barrows 
came out on top over approxi-
mately 450 head entered in the 
show. 

The barrow sold for $300.00 
over floor price to Cruce Auc-
tioneering Service of Plain- 

A Letter To The Community 

From The James Ensor Family 
over a rough time. 

When you look at a pile of 
rubble and ask, why, why -- the 
answer is provided by a won-
derful neighbor who gave us a 
card which is a part of our new 
home and is viewed in our kit-
chen -- 

course. In addition to the ob-
stacle course, entrants in the 
autorama went through a 
period of testing on actual 
highway driving. Approximate-
ly 25 miles of driving was in-
volved in individual testing. 

Whitesides, who is 15 years 
of age, competed with nine 
other persons in the autorama 
with the age of the competitors 
ranging from 15 to 20 years. 

In addition to the medal won 
by Whitesides, the Post re-
turned to Clovis with the 
second place trophy. The 
second place win makes the 
Police Explorers eligible to 
enter the National Explorer 
Olympics to be staged in 
Colorado sometime in 1976. 

Guy Whitesides, member of 
Clovis Police Explorer Post 827 
and son of Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Whitesides of Farwell, was one 
of seven members of Post 827 
who was entered in competi-
tion at the Explorer Olympics 
last weekend at Roswell and 
returned home with either a 
gold, silver or bronze medal. 

Whitesides, the only Explor-
er from Farwell entering the 
Olympics, was awarded a 
bronze medal when he placed 
in the "autorama" of the O-
lympics. 

According to Whitesides, the 
autorama is a testing of driv-
ing skills during which com-
petitors are required to drive 
through an obstacle course 
then back through the same 
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It takes the bitter and the 
sweet 

To make a life full and com-
plete 

Life is a mixture 
of sunshine and rain 
Laughter and teardrops 
pleasure and pain 
Low tides and high tides 
Mountains and plains 
Triumphs, defeats and losses 

and gains 
But always in all ways God's 

guiding and leading 
and he alone knows the things 

we're most needing 
And when He sends sorrow or 

some dreaded affliction 
Be assured that is comes with 

God's kind benediction 
And if we accept it as a gift of 

His love 
We'll be showered with bless-

ings 
from our Father above. 

Helen Steiner Rice 

Neighbors are great bless-
ings -- none greater than ours. 

MEXICO CITY TRIP WINNERS — Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Lingnau of Farwell, left, were 
named recipients of an all-expense paid six-day trip to Mexico City at the 37th Annual 
Meeting of the Deaf Smith Rural Electric Cooperative conducted March 1. The trip was 
offered by the Cooperative and the Lingnaus will take the trip sometime during 1975. They 
were presented the trip by planning committee chairman Pat Robbins. 

Lee Ann Williams 

Places In Rodeos 
Lee Ann Williams, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. Bert Williams 
of the Oklahoma Lane com-
munity and a member of the 
Farwell Chapter of the Tri-
State High School Rodeo Asso-
ciation, was entered in rodeo 
competition at Amarillo March 
1 and Gruver March 8. 

The March 1 rodeo was the 
Kiva Shrine Rodeo in Amarillo 
during which the local rodeoer 
took second place in the pole 
bending competition. 

At the Hat-Four Rodeo in 
Gruver March 8, Lee Ann 
came in third in pole bending 
and fifth in barrel race com-
petition. 

The wins have advanced Lee 
Ann to third place in pole 
bending and seventh in the 
barrel race in TSHSRA point 
standings. The top 15 rodeoers 
in point totals in each TSHSRA 
event will be eligible to enter 
the TSHSRA Finals Rodeo to 
be staged in Dumas later this 
season. 

James Ensor & Family 
Ruidoso, N.M. 

Our fire made front page 
news a year ago. The good 
deeds of hundreds of wonderful 
neighbors, who opened their 
hearts to us, has not received 
very much publicity. Most 
good news don't. 

Some say this life is a rat 
race, dog eat dog, look out only 
for no. 1, or who cares -- Don't 
believe it -- It would take hours 
to tell of the generous things 
people offered or gave when 
we really needed someone to 
care. No, we. haven't forgotten 
the neighbor who pulled off her 
coat and wrapped around our 
child who was shaking -- or the 
one who pretended to take our 
son home with her to try on 
her son's old clothes and re-
turned with him a complete 
new set from town. 

Some stranger might ask 
who are all these people? 
Answer 2- Black, white, every 
religious background, wealthy, 
poor, some total strangers --
May we always remember 
them and the Lord reward 
them. 

Our new home is almost 
complete. In a new area --
again many of the things in it 
are priceless -- gifts from a 
community shower. Why a new 
area? Health reasons. We have 
absolutely no bitterness but 
only a deep feeling of love and 
gratitude for all who helped us 

BRONZE MEDALIST -- Guy 
Whitesides, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Whitesides of Far-
well, displays the bronze med-
al he won in autorama com-
petition at the Explorer Olym-
pics last weekend in Roswell. 
Whitesides, a member of Clo-
vis Police Explorer Post 827, 
was awarded the medal after 
he competed with nine other 
Explorers in the autorama. 

Fire Calls 
Neither the Texico or the 

Farwell Volunteer Fire De-
partments received any emer-
gency vehicle or fire calls for 
this week. 
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