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Gossip Corner Produce Now 
Open In Gorman 

Mobile Blood Unit 
To Set Up Here 
Monday, May 13th 

Peanut Communities 
Alerted To GATT Threat The Gorman Lions Club will be 

sponsoring the Meek Blood Bank 
drive in Gorman on Monday, May 
13th. 

The unit will be set up at the front 
of the Fellowship Hall of the First 
United Methodist Church from 10 a. 
m. to 1 p. m. 

If you can donate blood to the 
fund, please check at the Gorman 
Pharmacy and sign up on the time 
sheet. 

This blood will be held in the blood 
bank for citizens of the Gorman 
community for a period of six 
months. 

If you do not get signed up before 
the date, you may come on up and 
sign in and donate to the fund. 

—GP— 
"Boss" Brett Ashley (left) and Cindy Ashley and Delton Keesee (assistants) are 
shown displaying some of the freshest fruits and vegetablcsto be found at the Gossip 
Corner Produce located on Highway 6 and Winkler next to D&S Fuel Company and 
KM Station. The will be offering the freshest fruits and vegetables at reasonable 
prices. 

Light Turnout 
Shown In Elections 

First United Methodist To 
Celebrate 100th Anniversary 

To compound the problem pea-
nut communities face, any interna-
tional trade agreement that may oc-
cur could be approved by Congress 
by fast track legislation if free trade 
advocates have their way. President 
Bush has asked that Congress extend 
fast track authority which would oth-
erwise have ended last March 1. Fast 
track means that the trade agree-
ment, which may include the loss of 
Section 22 importprotection for pea-
nuts, could only be voted yes or no by 
Congress without any changes being 
made by the Congressional Commit-
tees and without floor amendments. 

An effort will be made in both the 
House and Senate to disallow fast 
track, but to be successful such a 
resolution must receive a majority 
vote in either the House or Senate by 
June 1, 1991. Otherwise the Presi-
dent will have continuing fast track 
authority. 

Individuals in peanut producing 
communities have been urged to 
contact theirCongressman and Sena-
tors to communicate their feelings 
both on the upcoming vote on fast 
track as well as the danger of losing 
Section 22 protection for peanuts in 
any eventual GATT Agreement. 
Numerous meetings have been held 
throughout the Southwest to alert 

growers to the potential dangers in-
herent in the U.S. proposals to GATT. 
Although these meetings were well 
attended, there are many growers 
and local business people who did 
not attended a meeting. Growers and 
business peoaple who were not 
present at one of the meetings and 
who have not contacted their Con-
gressional delegation are urged to do 
so. For Congressional addresses or 
to receive help with your letters, you 
may contact the SWPGA director in 
your area or you may call the offices 
of the SWPGA, in Gorman, Texas, 
telephone 817-734-2222, the Okla-
homa Peanut Commission in Madill, 
Oklahoma telephone 405-795-3622 
or the Texas Peanut Producers Board 
telephone 817-734-2853. 

It should not be necessary at this 
point to emphasize the importance 
and urgency of following through 
with contacting U. S. Congressmen 
and Senators. The future of our 
peanut communities depend upon 
how Section 22 and the penaut pro-
gram fare in international GATT 
negotiations and the degree to which 
key U. S. elected officials are suc-
cessful in representing the peanut 
industry with members of the U. S. 
Trade Team and in decisions made 
by the U. S. Congress. 

KINDERGARTEN REGISTRATION 
Kindergarten registration will take place at the School 

Nurse's Room on May 22, 1991, beginning at 9 a.m. until 
12 noon, and from 1 p.m. to 3 p.m. 

In order to register your child, they must have a certified 
birth certificate; a record of immunizations showing at least 
three DPT's and 3 Polio shots - the last one being after the 
4th birthday. This record must also show that a HibCV 
Vaccine has been given, and a mandatory second MMR by 
the time the child reachers 12 years of age. 

2 TIMES 

Candidates for City Commissioner 
and School Board of Trustees were 
unopposed in the elections held on 
Saturday. and consequently the turn-
out of voters was rather light. 

In the City Election 77 votes were 
cast with Ann Maxfield receiving 75 
votes for Place Three amd Howard 
Hagood receiving 73 votes for Place 
One. 

Both candidates will be serving 
first terms on the Commission. 

Three incumbents were re-elected 
to the Gorman Independent School 
Board of Trustees. Robert Ervin 
polled 36 votes for a one year term, 
and Daryl Hirst received 44 votes 
and Windell Treadway received 42 
votes for three year terms. 

A total of 45 votes were cast in the 
school election. 

—GP— 

All Awards 
Banquet Slated 
For May 14th 

The GATT threat to peanut farm-
ers and communities with peanut 
production is for real. That word of 
caution comes from Benny Hagan of 
Cisco, Texas local director for the 
Southwestern Peanut Growers' As-
sociation. When the U. S. made its 
original proposal to GATT in 1987 
callin for elimination of all farm 
programs by the year 2000, most 
observers did not appear to take the 
proposal seriously. But the total 
commitment of the Bush Adminis-
tration to secure an international trade 
agreement is now universally con-
vincing and currently poses a direct 
threat to farm programs that depend 
on import protection under Section 
22 of the Agricultural Adjustment 
Act. Peanuts is one such commod-
ity. One of the principal goals of the 
U. S. proposal to GATT is elimina-
tion of all trade barriers. The protec-
tion that Section 22 provides to the 
peanut, cotton, sugar and dairy in-
dustries is considered by the Admin-
istration to be an import barrier. 

If Section 22 is eliminated or 
substantially altered, both Mainland 
China and Argentina stand ready to 
supply this country's peanut needs. 
China demonstrated in 1980 that it 
can supply peanuts to the U. S. at 
prices representing roughly half of 
the U. S. quota support price. We 
could not expect to see the retail 
price of peanut products drop below 
present levels as a result of lower 
prices of farmers stock peanuts. At 
least that has not been true in similar 
experiences in the past. Therefore, 
there would be no price advantages 
to American consumers of peanut 
producers - - only a reduction in 
quality by substituting foreign pro-
duced peanuts in American made 
products. 

Another phase of the U. S. pro-
posal to GATT calls for the elimina-
tion of "internal supports". For pea-
nuts the quota support program is 
one of the basic parts of the peanut 
program. Any reduction in the quota 
support level, would be extremely 
damaging to the effectiveness of the 
program. 

In other words the quickest way to 
kill the peanut program and with it 
the rural communities which it sup-
ports would be to remove Section 22 
for peanuts, or to reduce the qutoa 
support level. The U. S. Proposal to 
GATT would do both! 

Greg George Named 
Salutatorian De Leon High 

The annual All Awards Banquet is 
scheduled for Tuesday. May 14th in 
the school gym at 7 p. m. 

The meal will be catered by 
Miears Barbecue and tickets are $6 
each and the advance tickets may be 
purchased at Gorman Progress, Gor-
man High School, G&H Feeds, Clark 
Construction, Citizens State Bank 
and at the City Office. 

Anyone wishing to donate to the 
affair can contact Pam Childers at 
Gorman High School. 

The banquet is held each year to 
honor outstanding athletes and aca-
demic students at GHS. 

—GP— 
THANK YOU NOTE 

To each person who helped in any 
way during the fire at my house on 
Friday, please accept my heartfelt 
thanks for whatever you did. I 
appreciate all of you so much. 

Thanks again. 
James R. Daniels 

—GP— 

Jay Payton of Dallas. Ruby Rach-
els of Bedford and Bobbie Jean 
Payton visited with Johnnie and 
Mildred Landreth on Saturday. 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to thank everyone for 

the flowers, cards, visits and phone 
calls during my recent stay in Harris 
Hospital in Fort Worth, and since I 
have returned home. 

God bless you all. 
Lowell Rawls 

—GP— 

Neal Phillip Gurlin 
and Gwen Ellyn 
Utterburg Wed 

Gregory Layne George has been 
named Salutatorian of the 1991 gradu-
ating class of De Leon High School, 
with a four-year average of 95.216. 

Greg's high school activities in-
clude: Football 1, 2, 3, 4; Captain-
4; 1st team All-District Defense-3; 

All Area Football-4; Captain-4, Aca-
demic All-District-4; Class Presi-
dent-2; Vice-President 1; Honor Roll 
1,2,3,4; Academic Award 1,2,3,4; 
Student Council-2; Who's Who in 
Geometry-2; Spanish Club-2; Editor 
DeLeonian Yearbook-4; Student of 
the Month 2, 4; Baseball 1, 2, 3, 4; 
All District 1st Team-2; Honorable 
Mention-3; Best Dressed-2; Mcst 
Handsome-3; E.S.A. Academic 
Award 1, 2, 3, 4; National Honor 
Society 2, 3, 4, N.H.S. President-4; 
All D.H.S.-4; Academic Decathlon 
3, 4, 1st Place-4; Who's Who in 
Athletics-3, U.I.L. Regional Science 
-4; and Who's Who Among Ameri-
can High School Students 3, 4,. 

Greg is the son of Roger and 
Carolyn George of De Leon, the 
nephew of Bill Clark and grandson of 
Louise Clark and the late Othell 
"Speedy" Clark of Gorman and Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale George of De Leon. 

Underwood 
Reunion Held 

On Aoril 20th the Underwood 
kinfolk gathered at the Community 
Center in Munday for their annual 
reunion. 

Those attending were Vera Under-
wood, Gayla and Amanda Under-
wood, G. D. and Bonnie Underwood, 
Brownie and Royce Underwood, 
Tyler and Treron Stripling, Jim 

present church property, was bought 
for a parsonage. 

The church was a growing and 
thriving congregation abd felt the 
need for a larger, more imosing 
house of worship. The building 
committee began raising funds for 
the new church by subscribing 
$1,000 each. 

When the church was completed, 
there was a debt remaining of $l000. 
At a quarterly conference the con-
gregation voted to apply to the Board 
of Church Extension for a donation. 
Before the board met to act on the 
application Rev. Lee held a revival 
meeting and the full amount of the 
debt was raised on the last Sunday of 
the meeting (this was during a year 
when the pastor's annual salary was 
only $550). 

The new church building was 
dedicated January 26, 1908. 

In 1909 an outdoor tabernacle was 
built east of the church. Revivals wee 
held in the tabernacle for many 
years. 

During the oil boom in 1918. the 
tabernacle was leased to an ice 
company, but in 1933 it was repaired 
and again used for worship services 
until it deteriorated and had to be 
torn down. 

In the belfrey of the church hung a 
bell which was rung on Sunday 
mornings and also on special occas-
ions. The bell is still used today. 

During the years 1909-1910, the 
four room parsonage was replaced 
by a large two-story building. How-
ever, in 1915 the parsonage caught 
fire and was destroyed. A new 
parsonage was built and used until 
1963. 

The proud brick building that 
served the congregation for over 50 
years was a pretty church with a 
beautiful balcony and lovely memor-
ial stained glass windows. Time 
taking its toll on the sanctuary and 
the original steeple had to be 
removed after being found unsound. 

In 1957 during Rev. Robert Hayn-
es' first year as pastor, plans for a 
new church was founded. 

Many members left their mark on 
the building: Mr. R. C. Boswell built 
the copper steeple and baptismal for 
the sanctuary in a warehouse at the 
peanut mill. 

At completion. the church had an 
indebtedness of $22,500. This debt 
was to be paid in 15 years, but was 
paid in only six and one-half years. 

Dedication services were held 
March 28, 1965. 

Shortly before the dedication of 
the sanctuary a new parsonage was 
built under the direction of Rev. 
Robert Sanders. The parsonage is 
described as one of the nicest 
between Abilene and Fort Worth. 
Since its organization in 1891 the 
Gorman United Methodist Church 
has been served by 54 ministers, 
men and women of different 
strengths and talents. 

DESDEMONA CONGREGATION 
MERGES WITH GORMAN 

Paralleling the development of the 
Gorman Methodist Church, the Des-
demona Methodist Church was or-
ganized in 1870, and by 1895 it had 
become a mission in the Abilene 
District with a membership of 200. 
During the oil boom the church was 
reporting 438 members in 1925. In 
1919 a new church was constructed. 
Rev. H. H. Nance was pastor at the 
time. 

The Desdemona church has minis-
tered to the community for over a 
century, first as a part of the Dublin 
District and then as a mission of the 

Abilene District (Salem/Victor Cir-
cuit). In 1961 the conference began 
promoting the idea of larger parishes 
to give greater opportunities to their 
full time ministers. At that time, the 
Gorman, Hannibal and Desdemona 
churches were placed on the same 
circuit. 

In 1984, the Desdemona congrega-
tion was merged with the Gorman 
congregation, and the original corner 
stone of the Desdemona church was 
incorporated into the Gorman build-
ing to symbolize the harmony of two 
churches merged into one ongoing 
congregation. 

Through the years the church has 
known both growth and recession. 
Members have shared joys and 
sorrows with each other and with the 
community. 

The congregation has striven to 
extend its Christian faith into works 
and homes, in the community and 
abroad through conference and miss-
ion projects. 

Always. Gorman Methodists have 
trusted to fulfill the calling of every 
church: to be a part of the body of 
Christ in the world in which they find 
themselves. 

"We are what we are because of 
where we have been." If we have 
pursued God's plan for this church 
over the past 100 years. then God is 
pleased with our efforts. If we have 
fallen short of His purpose, then we 
are the lesser. 

The pastor. Rev. and Mrs. James 
Haynes, and the congregation invite 
everyone to come and help celebrate 
this historic occasion. 

Queen of Angels Catholic Church 
in Chicago was the setting for the 
April 19th wedding of Neal Phillip 
Gurlin, Jr. and Gwen Ellyn Utter-
berg of Chicago, Illinois. 

Mr. and Mrs. Neal Phillip Gurlin 
Sr. of Bolingbrook are the parents of 
the groom. Mrs. Lorainne Utterberg 
of Escondido, Calif. is the mother of 
the bride. 

The double ring ceremony was 
performed by Fr. Ceal Dresser. 
pastor of the church. 

Mary Ann Letendre of Agoura 
Hills, Calif. was the bridesmaid. 
Best man was Don Hilguard of 
Chicago. Don is a childhood friend of 
Neal. Usher was Richard Gurlin of 
Bolingbrook, brother of the groom. 

The bride wore a white spring 
satin gown with a long cathedral 
train. The groom, best man and 
usher wore black tuxedos. 

The bridesmaid wore a strapless 
dress with a black bodice and white 
skirt. She also wore a black elbo 
length gloves and black shoes. 

The flower girl was Emily Cole-
man of Chicago. She wore a black 
and white dress and black patten 
leather shoes. She carried a basket of 
pale yellow roses and baby's breath. 

The mother of the groom chose a 

First United Methodist Church 
will begin their 100th 	r celebra- 
tion with a four-day revival beginn-
ing Wednesday, May 15th. 

Former pastors will be preaching 
for the services. Rev. J. W. Hodges, 
who served as pastor (72-73) will 
preach Wednesday. He is pastor at 
Coolidge. Rev. Rawlyn Richter, now 
serving Oakdale Methodist in Steph-
enville was pastor here 1984-88. Rev. 
Donna Ware is associate pastor of 
the Arlington Methodist Church, 
served as pastor 1982-84. Frank 
Williams of Coolidge Church will 
preach Saturday. He was pastor here 
1970-72. 

The Methodist Quartet will pre-
sent the special music on Thursday 
night. 

Mrs. John Russell will present the 
Sunday morning special music. 

Bishop John Russell, District Sup-
erintendent of Dallas will deliver the 
Sunday morning worship service. 

Refreshments will be served in 
Fellowship Hall following the even-
ing services and a barbecue dinner 
provided by the church will be 
served at noon on Sunday. 

Gorman, in 1891 was a railroad 
settlement on the Houston and Texas 
Central Railroad, only two years old 
as a post office. As the settlement at 
Shinoak Springs moved to the rail-
road site, brush was cleared to 
enable the town to grow. A few 
stores, then a few more stores, then • a hotel and a lumber yard was built. 
Then a two story school house was 
constructed. But the community 
lacked the stabilizing influence of 
churches for its people. 

In May, 1891, Reverend H. S. 
Anglin organized the Horman Meth-
odist Episcopal Church South, with 
13 members, representing four fami-
lies. At annual conference that 
December, Gorman was made a part 
of the Carbon Circuit and Rev. R. H. 
Goode (a preacher on trial) was sent 
as its first officiating minister. 

There was at the time no church 
building in Gorman. All denomina-
tions used the school building for 
worship services. The Methodist 
held Sunday School at 3 p. m. and 
preaching on the first Sunday of the 
month. 

The little congregation grew stead 
ily, and in 1893 they bought for $35 
the lot on which the church now 
stands. A one room frame church 
was built on the lot in 1894. It was 
the first house of worship in Gorman. 
Planks laid across nail kegs served as 
seats for the first services, but after 
several months of dinners and ice 
cream suppers, the women of the 
church raised funds to replace the 
planks with oak pews. 

From that one room frame build-
ing built in 1894, the church has 
grown to encompass the beautiful 
block of buildings that today include 
the parsonage, sanctuary and educa-
tional building. Yet the story of the 
church is after all, the story of the 
men and women who make up the 
congregation. 

The Gorman Methodist Church 
was part of the Carbon Circuit from 
1891 to 1894, when the Gorman 
Circuit was organized. However, in 
1898 the General Conference placed 
the Gorman church on the Carbon 
Circuit. It was not until 1906 that the 
church, having grown to 161 mem-
bers, was made a full station. 

During the next two years, 141 
members were received into the 
church by Rev. W. J. Lee. It was 
during this time that a four-room 
house located northwest of the 

Underwood of Andrews; Jodie Un-
derwood, Jack Underwood. C. H. 
and Linda, Reed and Becky Under-
wood, Anne Underwood and Evelyn 
Underwood of O'Brien; Howard and 
Pat Hagood and E. L. Curb of 
Gorman; Murry E. Underwood of 
Fort Worth; Jay Payton of Dallas; 
Ruby Rachels of Bedford; Bobbie 
Jean Payton of Fort Worth; Roy B. 
and Mary Alice Underwood of Peta-
luma, Calif.; Cole and Dorothy 
Alsabrook, Janye U. Finch Ferrell 
and Frankie Joe Anglin. Dana R. 
Lanham, Bobbie Lynn Anderson, 
Billie Ray and Wat Morrow, Johnnie 
Ray Morrow, Johnnie Underwood, 
Johnnie Faye, Ford and Misty John 
Lanham, Margaret Marr, Carold 
and Bobbie Lanham, Jr. and Myra 
Reeves and Arnold and La Rue 
Reeves, and Beth Underwood. 

Everyone enjoyed the noon meal 
and visiting. After lunch everyone 
gathered around for picture making. 

Ruby Rachels was the oldest one 
present. She was 88 years young on 
March 14th. Ray B. and Mary Alice 
Underwood of Petaluma, Calif. trav-
eled the fartherest. 

fusha tea length gown, and the 
mother of the bride chose a pale pink 
dress. 

The brides presented both moth-
ers with pale yellow rose and baby's 
breath corsages. 

The rehearsal dinner -as held on 
April 18th at Schukins in Chicago. 

The reception was held after the 
ceremony at the Five Arts Club in 
Chicago. 

Mrs. Aletha Yarbrough of Gorman 
is the grandmother of the groom. 

Out of town guests included Mrs. 
Mary Beschorner of San Antonio, 
aunt of the groom. 



DESDEMONA 
NEWS  

VONNIE GUTHERY 
PHONE 75802665  

At Riley Gardner Memorial Service Company 
We Specialize In: 
▪ Permanent care cemetery lots 
▪ Granite and cement curbing 
' Stone cleaning and leveling 
' Quality memorials 
' Marble, granite & bonze vases. 
• Cemetery lettering _;,-7-9"  	rr17-77 ,7t; 

Dorothy Johnson Is our new representative for the Gorman 
Area If you need Dorothy, you may reach her at 817-734-2367. 

Grapefruit 
Cantaloupe 
Watermelon 

Blackeyed Peas 
Strawberries 

Lettuce 

Lemons 
Potatoes 
Jalapenos 

NOW OPEN 

Gossip Corner 
Produce 

Offering The Freshest 
Fruits and Vegetables 
At Reasonable Prices 

Corner of Winkler and Hwy. 6 
Open - 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 

Monday thru Saturday 
Sunday - 1:00 to 7:00 p.m. 

Squash 
Onion 

Okra 
Tomatoes 

New Potates 
Green Beans 

And Much, Much More!!!  

grasses, well fenced, 4 tanks, some 
minerals, live-oak trees, pavement and 
dirt road frontage - $500.00 acre. 
95+ ACRES, 2 BR Frame Home, Barn, 
Steel Corrals, 3 Tanks, Some Timber, 
Co-op Water, East of Carbon, 570,000. 
- Good Terms. 
1 ACRE M/L AT RUCKER - 2 Br, 
carpeted home, well, pavement, nice 
storage, satellite dish, $15,000.00 
10 A - M/L, edge Gorman, clean 3 - 1 
1/2 home, 2 BIG barns, big trees, fine 
well, city water, enjoy both Country 
and City life here. $40,000.00. 
1 + AC • 3 - 1 Frame, attached garage, 
storage building, Comer lot, garden to 
your hearts delight here. Only $ I 0,000 
Cash or 20% Down. 
1.5 ACRES - M/L between Gorman 
and Carbon, Clean 2 -1 partly insulated 
home, big oaks, city water, storage 
bldgs, fine garden, just off Hwy. Yours 
for 520,000. 
182 A + Near Hogtown, solid 2-1 home, 
big carport, excellent well, 2 tanks, 
spring, 20 cult, live oaks, lots hwy. 
front, deer area, rolling and scenic. 
$600.00 A - 1/4 Down 

(105 ACRES - Duster area - all native 

Real Estate 

COGBURN REALTY 
We WANT Your Listings - Peanut 
Farms - Houses - Small and Large 
Acreages. 

893-6666 	 DE LEON, TX 
6-228-F NC. 

NITA DANSB7 
REAL ESTATE COMPANY 

Co mme rc ial Residential 
Farm 

Ranch 

108 S. Texas 	 693-6441 

The Home You Have Admired! Beautiful 
Corner Lot - Roberts & Crescent! 3-1-1 
Brick; WBFP, Energy Eff. - Well Insu-
lated; Huge Pecans, Patio, Privacy Fence, 
Garden Areal 5,297-5097997 528,500.00. 
YOU CAN Own your own home! 3-1 
Frame on large lot in nice area - reduced to 
$6,500 
PEACE & QUIET! 2-1 Frame on 2+ 
Acres; N. Fisher St. Private well, sprinkler 
system & fenced yard! $16,500. 
BUDGET CONSCIOUS! Check 335 
Winkler! 3-1 1/2 Frame on comer lot; very 
spacious! Terms to Qualified' MAKE 
OFFER! 
56 ACRES- 11/2m. S. Hwy 679. Coastal, 
Trees & Terms! Owner Carry Note with 
Down Payment! 
80 ACRES- N. of Rucker. All in Cultiva-
tion; 3 wells! 20% down; 10% APR. Re-
duced to $500 per A. 

RAY'S REPAIR AND MANUFACTURING 
R 

RAY 

M 
INC. 

105E NINTH STREET 
CIS3O, TEXAS 76437 

JANE WOOTON RAY 
817/442-3433 

MACHINE SHOP 
SERVICE 

"We Want To Work For You" 
5.5-30 

PLUMBING REPAIRS 
Clark Construction 

734-2785 
FNC 

FULLEN MOTOR CO. IS PLEASED TO ANNOUNCE THAT 
WE WILL HONOR FORD'S OR GMC'S $500.00 DIRECT 
MAIL COUPON TOWARDS THE RETAIL PURCHASE OR 
RETAIL LEASE OF ANY NEW 1990-91 OK PICKUP OR 
CHASSIS-CAB. THIS ALLOWS YOU UP TO A $1,500.00 
REBATE ONE SELECT MODELS. CUSTOMERS CAN 
USE THEIR COUPON AS DOWN PAYMENT OR RECEIVE 
CASH BACK IN THE FORM OF A CHECK FROM 
CHEVROLET. THERE'S NO BETER TIME THAN NOW 
TO MAKE A CHANGE FOR THE BETTER!!! 

FULLEN 
MOTOR COMPANY 

305 East Main Eastland 629-2676 

BIG 
COUNTRY 
CHEVROLET 
DEALERS 

THE yes-'OF WEST TEX 

?WAYS 
CHEVROLET 
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GARAGE SALE: Friday 8:00 a.m. and Sat-
urday til 12. 523 Pershing Street. Lots of good 
household items, clothes, BBQ grill, crafts, 
electric Welder, Welding Torches, W. C. 
Browning. 	 1-5-9 P. CLA 	. 

DIRT WORK: Dump Truck Service - Lot 
Preparation and Leveling - Driveway and 
Road Material -- Sand -- 'Topsoil. Reason- 
able. K. D. Boyd, 734-2122. 	2-3-FNC. 

EARN WEEKLY INCOME!! Assembling 
products. For free details rush self-addressed 
stamped envelope to: Home Employment, P. 
0. Box 143, Gorman, Texas 76454. 2-5-16 p. 

the Desdemona First Baptist 
Church. 

"Happy Birthday" on May 9th to 
our brother, Mack "Red" Keith in 
Gorman from Vonnie and Pug Guth-
ery and family of Desdemona. 

The annual meeting of the Victor 
Cemetery Association will be held 
Saturday, May 25th with a business 
meeting following lunch. Bring a 
basket lunch and spend the day 
visiting family. friends and neigh- 

bors. 
Remember the sick and shut-ins in 

our community with your cards and 
prayers. A card and short note will 
brighten their day. 

Merlene Wisdom spent the past 
week in Andrews with her daughter, 
Marsha Johnson, Billy and Chris. 
Chris is reported doing much better 
since he got the body cast removed. 
Marsha and boys accompanied Mer-
lene back home over the weekend. 

GARAGE SALE: Friday ano Saturday, 8 til. 
Clothes - Men's & Ladies; miscellaneous, 
paper backs, tools. Hailes residence, Duster 
Highway. 	 1-5-9 P. 

FOR LEASE: 10 acre pecan orchard. W. C. 
Browning - Phone 734-2421. 	3-5-23 P. 

"Congratulations" to Nikki Robi-
nett of De Leon who won First Place 
in the State Spelling Competition in 
Austin last Saturday, May 4th. Nikki 
is the granddaughter of Bernard and 
1.tin Keith of Desdemona and the 
daughter of De and Vicki Robinett of 
De Leon. 

Neta Gee of Ranger and her sister, 
Bill and Bobbie Adams of Fort 
Worth, were visitors last Sunday at 

Tomatoes- Peppers-Herbs - Flowers 
Calladlum Bulbs - 70c 
Canna Bulbs • $1.00 

Tarver's Plant Farms 
Rt. 3 (Ranger Hwy.) 

Gorman, Texas 	734-3218 

Cash For Spinette Pianos - Call 817-965- 
4221. 	 1-5-9 C., FOR SALE: 2 Lots on Corner of Potter 

and Hamilton. For information Call 817- 
734-3198 after 5:00 p.m. 	4-5-16 C. 

r  
DO LAWN WORK - MOWING - 

• WEED EATING - EDGING. I • 

I CHARGE ACCORDING TO THE 111 
SIZE OF TILE YARD AND SERV ICE. 

I CALL DANIEL REEVES AT 734- I 
2812. 	 4-5.16 P. 

BRAND NEW RUN-FREE PANTY HOSEI  
Not sold in stores 4/520 unconditionally 
guaranteed and patented. Also, exclusive 
marketing rights w/ground level MLM 
COMPANY...OPPORTUNITY BUSINESS 
MEETING SCHEDULED for Friday 10th. 
Call Comanche 915-356-2906 for details as 
soon as possible! Reservations need to be 
made! SERIOUS INCOME OPPORTUNITY' 

1-5-9 C. 

Nursing Home Week 
Slated For May 
1 2- 1 8 at Canterbury 

Canterbury Villa of Gorman Nurs-
ing Home would like to invite 
everyone to come by and visit with 
them during Nursing Home Week 
May 12-18. 

On Wednesday, May 15th Canter-
bury Villa will be serving a compli-
mentary hot dog to everyone coning 
by the nursing home from 11:30 a. 
m. to 1 p. m. 

Everyone is cordially invited to 
come by. 

THREE FAMILY GARAGE SALE: Satur- 
day - May 11th from 8:00 to 4:00 - 303 West 
Hall - one block behind Peanut Hut. Weather 
Permitting. 	 1-5-9 C. 

I 

4 /t. Ci 
Gouserir 

REAL MATT 

BARBARA LOVE, Broker 
HIGHWAY 80 EAST 

817-629-1725 
EASTLAND, TX 76448 

NICE LOCATION for this 3 BR, 1 3/ 
4 bath brick on 2.25 acres. Cen. h/a, total 
elect. & morel ONLY 545,000.00 
82.9 ACRES: 45 acres coastal, with 
balance in timber. Stock tank, 2 wells 
w/pumps, MINERALS. 
NEAT FAMILY HOME -- 3 BR, 2 
bath brick. Some built-ins, cen. WA 
160 ACRES: 40 acres in field w/bal-
ance in pasture. Good dove and deer 
hunting. 
REMODELLED 3 BR, 2 bath frame 
on corner lot. 
IT MAY BE SMALL But so is the price 
of this 1 BR, 1 bath frame home w/au. 
Carport 
82 ACRES: Approx. 1/2 in cult., small 
tank. Owner will convey minerals. 
FAMILY HOME -- Unique 5 BR 
frame home on large lot. Plenty of closet 
space; nice trees. 
4 BR, 2 bath Frame Home. CH/CA, 
water well, pretty lot with large trees, 
nice home. MUST SEE! G2 

FOR SALE: Bar Stools - $20 Each. Boys/ 
Mens suits - $20 - Roll-a-way Bed - $20. Wood 
doors and storm door - $10 Each. 335 S. Fisher 
-734-2121. 	 1-5-9P. 

-GP- 
M/SGT. CHARLEY D. MAJORS 
RETURNS FROM DESERT STORM 

Air Force Chief Master Sgt. 
Charley D. Majors has returned to 
his home station from Operation 
Desert Storm. 

Majors, an aircraft manager, is 
homebased at Rhein-Main AFB in 
Frankfurt, Germany. 

He is the son of Lois I. Majors of 
Route 3, Gorman. 

The chief is a 1966 graduate of 
Desdemona High School. 

INEYL. 
Our 

"Granny Sue" 
IS FIFTY 

Happy 
Birthday 

Love - Adam and Colby 

NOW ACCEPTING APPLICATIONS: We 
want honest, reliable workers who are eager to 
please our customers. Full or part-time. Gor- 
man Dairy Queen - 734-2450. 	2-5-16 C. 

GRADUATION AND WEDDING SPE-
CIAL: Monogrammed Towels - $10 each. 
Price includes towel and up to 10 letters!! 
Order before May 18th for Graduation. Joy 
Campbell 734-2121. 	 2-5-16 P. 

MOBILE HOMES FOR SALE: 
NEW U. L. APPROVED 

Doublewides Starting At Only $298.00 Per 
Month For A 3+2 Del. & Setup With Air. Best 
Values And Selection In Texas. Art's Homes 
In Granbury 817-326-2392 or 1-800-621- 
7196. 	 1-5-9 C. 

PHOTO PROCESSING 
Jumbo or Twin-Regular Prints 

Roll of 12 - $2.99; Roll of 15 - $3.99 
Roll of 24 - $5.99 

and Roll of 36 - $7.99 
COWMAN PHARMACY 

5-11-FNC. 

BIG GARAGE SALE: 407 Lexington - Bob 
Hodges home - Saturday, May 11 - 8 a.m. - 6 
p.m. - Tools of all Kinds, Electric grinder, drill 
and saw, Small tool shed, BBQ grill ( home-
made ). Windmill for yard, yard chain, CB 
with antenna, Clothes, Miscellaneous items. 
Lots - Lots More! 	 1-5-9 C. 

FOR SALE - Set Bed Springs. 
Estelle Craddock, 734-2363. 4-4fnc 

DE LEON VARIETY 
DE LEON FLORAL 

SEARS CATALOG STORE 
Open Monday thru Saturday 

8:00 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. 
10-29-FNC. 

FOR RENT: Nice 4 bedroom, 2 bath home, 
central air and heat on large lot. Call 734-3198 
after 5:00 p.m. or before 7:00 a.m. 4-5-23 C. 

FOR SALE: 2-1-2 House -Fenced yard - 3 
bldgs. - Completely renovated. Call 734-2951 
- 119 Scurry - Gorman. 	 2-5-9 P. 

MISCELLANEOUS HELP WANTED: 
GET PAID for taking easy snapshots! No 
experience. $900.00 per 100. Call 1-900-230-
3636 ($0.99/min.) or Write: PASE-D2650, 
161 S. Lincolnway, N. Aurora, II 60542. 

4-5-16 P. 

MOBILE HOMES FOR SALE: 15 
Doublewides and 25 Singlewides,'All At Bar-
gain Prices. We Are Ready To Deal. Art's 
Homes In Granbury 817-326-2392 Or 1-800- 
621-7196. 	 1-5-9 C. 

WANTED: Registered nurse for Weekend 
shift. Also Certified Nurse Aids on 7:00 to 
3:00, 3:00 to 11:00 and 11:00 to 7:00 shifts. 
Apply at De Leon Nursing Home (behind De 
Leon Hospital) Bettie Sawyers, Administra- 
tor. 	 1-24-FNC. 

FOR SALE: Round Bales of Coastal Hay. 
Loading Available. 817-893-2975. 2-21-fnc. 

FOR RENT: Mobile home, fully furnished, 2 
bedroom, close to school. Call 734-2578 or 
893-2097. 	 1-17-FNC. 

-a 	AVERY HOME REPAIR SERVICE 
kviiCkes  
ww eTh, 	General Repairs - Electrical 

Plumbing -- Carpentry 

C. M. AVERY 	 P. 0. Box 478 
Phone 817-734-2289 	 GORMAN. TX 76454 

TRY 

MAW-KENNEDY'S 
Ranch Hand - Yeast Bread 

Now Featured At 

SAV-ON Food, Inc. & Bob's Grocery 
IN GORMAN 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES MADE: No Labo 
Charge when fabrics, etc., are bought from our 
store. Free estimates. W. H. Smith Depart- 
ment Store, Phone 893-2135. 	5-26-FNC. 

FOR YOUR SHOPPING NEEDS AND 
CONVENIENCE, STOP IN AT SEARS 
CATALOG AGENCY IN DE LEON OR 
CALL 893-2086. 	 11-21-FNC. 

SAVE ON CARPET: Buy at Wholesale plus 
10% and freight. CASH -- NO STAMPS. W. 
H. Smith Department Store, De Leon, Tex. 

5-26-FNC. 

SALYER CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 
Highway 6 East 
Dublin, I exas 

Complete Lab, X-Ray & Treatment Facility 
All Insurance Accepted. 

Phone (817) 445-3317 or (817) 445-2205 

'aka\ L 	  
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*On models built after about 2/6/91. ?See these limited warranties and their restrictions at your dealer. 

HURRY IN FOR A MONSTROUS DEAL 
BRUNER Motors, Inc. 

Pirgiuth  ETHF  South Loop at Hwy. 281 Posy Truths 

770 BLICXLE UP. AND P1FAU  DRIVE way 	 Phone 1-800-880-3325 or 817-968-5006 

Advantage: 
Dodge. 

In 
0 

Dodge BUCKLE UP• .AND PLEASE DRIVE SAFELY 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS PAGE THREE MAY 9, 1991 Johnny Truman 
Williams Laid To 
Rest On Friday 

Oakland Cemetery 
Assocation Meets 

Bessie May Morris 
Services Held 
Monday 

Masonic Lodge- 
Eastern Star To Honor 
Students-Teachers 

Gorman Masonic Lodge No. 716 
and the Eastern Star Chapter No. 
443 will have an open meeting 
Thursday evening, May 9 at 7 p. m. 

Students chosen for the 1991 
Citizenship Scholarship Awards. 
Kevin Hirst, Steven Taylor, Angela 
Treadway and John Mart Stephens. 
will be honored along with another 
student. Kim Broom. and a teacher, 
Mrs. Ruby Lee Kinser, who will 
receive special awards from the 
Gorman Masonic Lodge for out-
standing achievements in education. 

All members of the recipients 
families, their friends and the public 
are cordially invited to attend. 

There will be a short program 
followed by refreshments in the 
dining hall. 

CARD OF THANKS 
In appreciation of the showings of 

your love and kindness in the loss of 
our dad and your friend, John 
Williams, we would like to return a 
little by saying thank you all for 
everything you did for our family in 
this our time of need. Thanks for 

your love and support conveyed to us 
in the many ways shown, such as the 
cards, flowers, (especially whoever 
brought the little vase of wildflow-
ers), food and prayers. A special 
thanks to Ray and the staff at 
Higginbothams. There couldn't have 
been a better tribute to dad. And to 
Richard Watson for your words of 
love and truth. 

We are grateful to everyone. 
Thank you. 

The Family of John Williams 
W. E. Williams 

Joe and Kathi Williams 
Johnny and Renita Williams 

Lucy Ann Mays 
Jerry Frame 

Haynes, Mr. and Mrs, Marion 
Dennis, James and Ruby Lee Kinser. 
Marjorie Treadway, Ethel Weaver. 
Georgie Stacy, Frankie Stacy, Homer 
M. Kirk, Dean Dennis. Lorene 
Dennis, Linda Dennis Clark, Roy 
Dennis. Opal Burton. E. L. Curb, 
Hope Joiner, Amber Craddock, Mol-
lie Lester and Jewell Huddleston. 

BLIZZARD® I 
FLAVOR TREAT 

—GP— 

12-oz. 
-; • 	• Cs,. 
-4 *. 
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Bessie May Morris, C:6 of Keller. 
formerly of Carbon, passed away 
Saturday, May 4 in a Keller nursing 
home. 

Graveside services were held at 10 
a. m. Monday at the Murray 
Cemetery in Carbon. Rev. Dale 
Jackson and Euell Allison officiated 
under the direction of Edwards 
Funeral Home of Eastland. 

Born in Blanket, she attended 
school in the Brown County area. 
She married Ned Ira Morris on 
February 18. 1922 in Brownwood. He 
preceded her in death in 1969. She 
was a housewife and mother and a 
member of the First Baptist Church 
of Carbon. 

Survivors include three daughters. 
Virginia Jessen of Cheyenne, Wyo., 
Yvonne Hansard of Colorado Springs 
Colo. and Bettye Johnson of Fort 
Worth; 8 grandchildren; and 15 
great-grandchildren. 

Johnny Truman Williams. 69, 
passed away Tuesday, April 31 at an 
Abilene hospital. 

Graveside services were held at 
10:30 a. m. Friday at the Oakland 
Cemetery with the Rev. Richard 
Watson officiating, directed by Hig-
ginbotham Funeral Home. 

Born in Blanket, he moved to 
Gorman 20 years ago. 

He was a carpenter, a Baptist, a U. 
S. Navy veteran of World War 11 and 
the widower of Judy Cole Williams. 

Survivors include two sons, John-
ny Elvin Williams of Harmony, 
Okla., and Clifton Joe Williams of 
Gorman; two daughters, Lucy Ann 
Mays of Brownwood and Carolyn 
Sue Williams of Jonesboro, Ga.; his 
father, Wes Elvin Williams of Blank-
et; and two grandchildren. 

A stepson. Jerry Frame of Hobbs, 
N. M. is a survivor. 

Pallbearers were Ronald Bennett, 
Dale Hogan, Terry Don Scott, Davy 
Alston, Rodger Woodall and Duane 
Henon. Honorary pallbearers were 
Curtis Rice, Claro Guerra, Charles 
Rodgers, Charles Buckmaster, Ken-
neth Lewis and John Johnson. 

—GP— 

YOUR 
CHOICE! 
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Cheerleader Mini- 
Clinic Slated For 
May 13-17 

The 1991 Oakland Cemetery Asso-
ciation's business meeting was held 
this past Saturday, May 4th on the 
cemetery grouunds at the entrance 
to the gate. 

Bill Haynes. president, called the 
meeting to order at 10 a. m. Marion 
Dennis gave the opening prayer. 

Opal Burton, secretary-traeasurer, 
read the minutes of the 1990 
meeting, which were approved with 
no corrections. A cash balance of 
$4,750.50 is in the checking account 
and a balance of 58.872.95 is set 
aside in invested funds. 

J. W. (Judd) Thompson of Gorman 
is the year-round caretaker and 
everyone expressed satisfaction for 
the well-kept grounds and the level-
ing of the red clay that had eroded 
near the entrance. 

10 cemetery lots have been sold 
during the past year at the current 
price of $50 each. Anyone wishing to 
make a memorial contribution to the 
cemetery funds will be welcomed for 
plans were discussed about hiring 
someone with heavy duty equipment 
to straighten and balance headstones 
that have become unbalanced due to 
soil erosion. 

The current officers were re-elect-
ed to serve another year. E. L. Curb 
gave the dismissal prayer. 

Those attending were Bill and Nan 

Future Cheerleader 
Shirts Now Offered 

DOUG McCOLLUM IS CANDIDATE 
FOR AMERICAN FARMER 
DEGREE AT BRECKENRIDGE 

More than 200 members and 
guests of the Breckenridge FFA 
recognized award winners at their 
annual Pig Roast on Thursday night. 

Among those recognized was 
Doug McCollum, who is a candidate 
for the prestigious American Farmer 
Degree. 

Doug is the son of Barbara Seaton 
of Gorman and Rodney McCollum of 
Hobbs. N. M. 

BREEZE® 
FROZEN YOGURT TREAT 

12-oz. 

MENDER 

1491 

BREAKFAST 
Monday - Oatmeal. toast, juice 

and milk. 
tuesday - Eggs, bacon, toast, juice 

and milk. 
Wednesday - Muffins, juice and 

milk. 
Thursday - Rice, toast, juice and 

milk. 
Friday - Pancakes, sausage, syrup 

juice and milk. 
LUNCH 

Monday - Pigs-n-a-blanket, pork-
n-beans, salad, fruit and milk. 

Tuesday - Chalupas, cheese, let-
tuce, corn, hot sauce, fruit and milk. 

Steal fingers, cream potatoes, 
green beans, gravy, hot rolls, brown-
ie and milk. 

Thursday - Pizza, salad, fruit, 
cookie and milk. 

Friday - Hamburgers, cheese, all 
the trimmings, french fries, ice 
cream and milk. 

ON SALE AT 
DAIRY OUEEN 

APRIL 29 - 
MAY 19,1991 

This year the Junior High Cheer-
leaders are selling Future Cheer-
leader T-Shirts. if you are interested 
in purchasing a T-Shirts for your 
daughter, a niece or a granddaugh-
ter, please contact one of the Jr. 
High Cheerleaders by May 15th. 
Payment is due upon ordering the 
shirt. We will need a name and shirt 
size. Sizes seem to run small. 
Youth:S/M/L S8 and Adult: S/M/L/ 
and XL $9. 

The money girls make will enable 
them to attend camp this summer. 

Gaytha Bear, Sponsor 

Crimestoppers 
Call 629-TIPS TEXAS PRESS 

ASSOCIATION 

MOTHERS My 
SPECIALS 

S hop Earty For Good Selection 
Dresses, Mouses, Shirts, Stacks, 

Handbags, Lingerie, YeweCry 
FREE Gift Wrapping 

1 / 3 OFF 

LASATER'S 
Downtown Gorman, Tx - 734-2310 

A Cheerleading Mini Clinic will be 
presented by the Gorman Junior 
High Cheerleaders on May 13 thru 
17th. 

Session 1 will be from 4 to 4:50 for 
Kindergarten thru Third Grade. 

Session 2 is from 5 to 5:50 for 
Fourth Grade through Sixth Grade. 

Refreshments woll be served at 
break time. 

Cost is $15 for One Week Mini 
Camp. 

There will be four days of instruc-
tion and the last day will be the 
"Shiw Day" for parents, family and 
friends to come and see what the 
students have learned in their sess-
ions. Please feel free to video and 
take pictures. 

To enroll or for more information 
call Lacy Pack, 639-2480: Marla 
Smith, 639-2319; Jennifer Scitern, 
639-2265; Allison Treadway, 639-
2317; Keri Scitern, 639-2236 and 
Jenny Goode, 734-2237. 

® Reg U S Pat. A Tm. Olt Am. D.0 Corp. 
C' Tx. D O. Op. Court At pa:to:paling Davy Queen stores 

guests were Clifford and Lurlene 
Nelson of Carbon and Rease Rodgers 
of Ranger. They all attended Green 
Acres Baptist Church in Stephenville.  
with other relatives and friends. 
Gathered for lunch at the Golden 
Corral. After lunch on to Ranger to 
visit with Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Ridling and cousins for the after-
noon. A good time was had by all. 

Joe Bennett visited on Saturday 
afternoon in Weatherford with his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bennett. 
and their granddaughter. 

—GP— 

KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 

Larry and Betty Strube and a 
friend. Edith Bibb of Rising Star, 
were in Houston part of last week 
where Betty had her eyes checked. 
While there they visited the Bill 
McFalls. Visiting with the Strubes 
upon -returning home were Billy 
Strulae of De Leon, Floyd and Elaine 
Burke of Lake Leon, Elvis and 
Johnnie Chambers of Comanche, 
Holland and Rea Crawley and Colois 
and Pauline Crawley of Arlington, 
Dean and Ann Stephenson of Co-
manche and Windy Warren of 
Gorman. 

The Carl Cole family enjoyed as 
their guests last week, Wanda's aunt 
and uncle Bobbie and Russell Jack-
son of Houston. Over the weekend 

Coming to a Dealer Near You! 

THE 

THE DODGE CUMMINS 
TURBO DIESEL PICKUP! 

The Dodge Cummins Turbo Diesel pickup is the true heavyweight of 
diesel pickups. It beats Ford and Chevy diesels in towing, torque 

and available payload and with enough muscle to tow over 5 tons. 
Right now, your dealer has a good selection of these monstrous 

trucks in stock with these features: "My heat pump's so efficient it 
saves mopey And it's a clean 

gstem. HEM whatk means for 
e environment • —Elia Chandler 

Park Board Member 

Elta Chandler cools and heats her home with a heat pump because it saves money and 
energy. And since it's electric, it's "wonderfully clean." 

A heat pump uses the energy in the air to keep her home comfortable all year. 
Even on cold winter days there's heat in the air. A heat pump captures that heat and 
uses it. 

And it costs less to operate than a gas furnace. It's so efficient that for each unit of 
energy it uses, it creates two to three units of heat. 

In the summer a heat pump becomes a high-efficiency air conditioner, capturing 
the heat inside the home and removing it. 

For more information, call a heat pump dealer or TU Electric. It's your chance to 
save more than money. • 

• Five Tons Of Available Towing 

• 400 lbs-ft Torque 

• Direct Injection System 

• 7170 Powertrain Warrantyt 

• 5.9 Liter 6 Cylinder 

• Intercooled Turbocharged Engine* 

• Central Intake Manifold Heater 

• 7/100 Engine Warrantyt 

77 WELECTR IC 
A Commitment To Service 



SHOW MOM HOW MUCH 
YOU CAME WITH FLOWERS 

Mother's Day, Sunday, May 12 

Gene and Carolyn Foster 
Phone817-734-2519 	Gorman, Texas 

KOKOMO 
NEWS  

ZELDA JORDAN 
PHONE 639-2289 

Saturday, May 4 was a great day 
at Kokomo for the eighty people who 
registered at the annual Homecom-
ing and Kokomo-Simpson Cemetery 
Association meeting with lots of 
visiting and reminiscing. 

The Cemetery Association meet-
ing got underway at the tabernacle at 
the Simpson Cemetery at 10 a. m. 
with Delmon Eaves, president, pre-
siding. Opening prayer was by Orval 
Treadway. 

Delmon expressed thanks to the 
committee for their efforts and time 
put into the association this year. 
Members of the committee were 
Orval Treadway, Bill Eaves, Wil-
bourne Wood, Bobbie Brown, Zelda 
Jordan, Cleo Duncan, and Ima 
Brown. The terms of Bobbie Brown, 
Cleo Duncan and Ima Brown expired 
this year. Bobbie Brown is a lifetime 
trustee and will not be replaced on 
the committee. Norman Webb and 
Larry Strube were elected to the 
committee. 

Appreciation was extended to 
Delmon Eaves for the great job he 
has done keeping the cemetery this 
year. 

Also recognized was Sarah Hen-
dricks Tuggle of Ranger as the oldest 
person in attendance. Brittany Ste-
phens of Stephenville as the young-
est, and Jack Hopper of Roswell, N. 
M. as coming the fartherest. Britt-
ney came with her grandmother, 
Mary Esther Webb of Nimrod. 

After the meeting, they gathered 
at the Kokomo Community Center 
for a covered dish lunch and more 
visiting. Delmon Eaves voiced the 
prayer of thanks for the food. Clifton 
Thompson of Ogden, Utah, Ruby 
Johnson of Bisbee, Ariz. and Nelma 
Murdoch of Phoenix, Ariz. were 
among those traveling long distances 
to be here for the homecoming. They 
did not arrive in time to be recogniz-
ed in the cemetery meeting. 

A good time was had by all 
attending, and everyone enjoyed the 
piano music by Billie Timmons 
Stacy. 

In the committee meeting follow-
ing the annual meeting, Norma 
Webb was elected as treasurer. The 
other officers will remain the same 
as last year: Delmon Eaves, presi-
dent; Orval Treadway, vice-presi-
dent; and Zelda Jordan, secretary. 

Special music was rendered by 
the choir, under the direction of 
Woodrow Browning, at the Sunday 
morning service at the Kokomo 
Baptist Church. Those singing were 
James and Jill Little, Kay Snider, 
Jimmy and Verna Lee Little, Wanda 
Rainey, Joe and Glynda Bond, Helen 
Browning, Brian Bond and Gary 
Browning, with Wynelle Brown at 
the piano. 

Scott Callum of Huckabay spent 
Friday with his grandparents, Gene 
and Kay Snider. 

Lavell Hallmark and Becky Mekes-
ka, Shane and Sheyanne of San 
Angelo spent Wednesday night with 
Dora Garrett. Jimmy and Verna Lee 
Little were dinner guests of Mrs. 
Garrett on Saturday, abd Ruth 
Bryant was also a visitor with Dora. 

Ida Lewis, Iola Johnson, S. Dec 
Gilmore, Dorothy Beaty, Mae Quinn 
and Ora Mae Atchison. 

Those visiting Ida Lewis were Ora 
Lee Lawrence. Sue Seaton, Doyle 
Poynor, Mayvis Lasater and Ima 
Brown. 

On Tuesday morning we had a 
council meeting and elected Genie 
Leeper as president and S. D. 
Gilmore as Resident of the Month. 

Those visiting Veno and Annie 
Hale were Buryl Rodgers, Waldene 
Jones of Dublin and Anna Rush. 

Those coming for singing on 
Tuesday were Willo Rice, Billie 
Stacy, Ava Rodgers, Anna Rush, 
Berneice Rodgers, Annie Faye Fos-
ter, Cricket Walker. Joe O'Neal, 
Melba Frasier and Velma Bennett. 

Those visiting Vertie Self were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Burns of Fort 
Worth, Mrs. Dave Freeman of 
Arlington, Joe Barnett of Eastland, 
Vera Rodgers, Cecil and Christine 
Self, Nettie Denton, Gladys Cham-
bless, Zina Simpson, Curtis and Neta 
Maness, Tracey Taylor, Bud Smithey 
Lorene Foster, Nancy Hendricks, 
Cathy, Jenny and Tana Goode. 

Emma Shugart attended the wed-
ding of her granddaughter, Sha 
Shugart, and Bill Galloway on Sun-
day. April 28 at the First Baptist 
Church in Strawn. Sha is the daughte 
r of Bud and Judy Shugart of Strawn. 

On Wednesday morning Ron Car-
roll brought the devotional for 13 
residents. 

Those visiting Ruby Pullig were 
Buryl Rodgers, Ima Brown. Earl and 
Virginia Stone of Granbury, Gladys 
Chambless and Nancy Hendricks. 

On Wednesday afternoon Mrs. 
Rush brought bananas for bingo. 
Norma Redford and Nancy Hen-
dricks helped Anna. Winners were 
Genie Leeper,S. D. Gilmore, Emma 
Shugart, Dorothy Beaty. Ora Mae 
Atchison, Ruby Vandergriff, Iola 
Johnson, Veno Hale, Mae Quinn. Ida 
Lewis, Cynthia Earles, Jess Hall-
mark. 

Mrs. Marvin Jones of Dublin 
visited her brother, Hulon Perry. 
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The 2nd Friday Night Musical at the Gorman Old Fire Hall is set for 
Friday, May 10th. Concession stand opens at 5:00 p.m. Musicians and 
visitors are welcome. 

CANTERBURY  VILLA  
day of Fort Worth, Lee Carlton of 
Eastland, Kay Warren Ladd, Shirley 
Morgan of Olden and Johnny Thack-
erson. 

On Sunday morning Rev. Ron 
Carroll of First Baptist Church 
taught the Sunday scjool lesson for 9 
residents. 

Those visiting Cleo Clement and 
Mae Quinn were Mr. and Mrs. Artie 
Skaggs, Marie White, Elsie Robinett 
of De leon, Glen and Shirley Clement 
of Lake Leon, Fern Walenberger of 
Sundown, Mayvis Lasater, Iris Pres-
ton, Winnell 'Browning and Sue 
Seaton. 

At 2:30 on Sunday those from the 
First Baptist Church of Carbon 
coming for services were Hazel 
Campbell, C. 0. Sandlin, Cricket 
Walker, Dale and Nancy Jackson and 
Johnnie Naughton. 

Those visiting Cody and Pauline 
Love were Vernon and Artie Skaggs 
of De Leon, Willadean Ormsby of 
Stephenville, Carol Ray Ervin of 
Desdemona, Frankie Jo Shipman, 
Winnelle Browning, Joe O'Neal, 
Lavoyce Hirst, Mavis Lasater. Ruth 
Higginbottom and Tommye Haile. 

At 4 p. m. on Sunday those coming 
from the Gorman Church of Christ 
were Bro. T. A. Grice, Bro. and Mrs. 
Curtis Maness, Vera Rodgers, Willa-
dean Ormsby. Odie Brightwell, Dur-
wood Webb, Zina Simpson. Clara 
Mae Frossard, Tracey Tayloe, Bud 
Smithey, Lorene Foster, Cathy, Jen-
ny and Tana Goode, Murtice Rod-
gers, Floydene Gilbert. 

Visiting Jess Hallmark were Toby 
Cordell of Dallas, Wilma Cordell, 
Irene Hallmark, Carolyn and David 
Moore. 

On Monday morning Betty had 
exercises for 12 residents. 

Those visiting Genie Leeper ans 
Dorothy Beaty were Nettie Denton, 
Rhoda Burney, Effie Jones of Hobbs, 
N. M., Harold Wilkerson, Dottie 
Poole, Nellie Lucky, Candice Burney 
S. D. Gilmore, Emma Shugart and 
Mayvis Lasater. 

Nancy Hendricks helped with bin-
go on Monday. Buryl Rodgers gave 
bingo prizes. Winners were Ruby 
Vandergriff, Jess Hallmark, Cynthia 
Earles, Veno Hale, Genie Leeper, 

GORMAN LIONS CLUB BLOOD DRIVE 
Gorman Lions Club will sponsor a Blood Drive to start a 
Blood Bank for Gorman thru Meek Blood Bank of Abilene 
on Monday, May 13th. The Meeks Mobile Van will be 
setup by the Methodist Church Fellowship Hall. 

We extend our sympathy to Mr. 
Joe Bennett and his family on the 
loss of their beloved Maxine Ben 
nett. May the Good Lord bless you. 

VARONA TAYLOR HONORED 
On Sunday, April 28 Mrs. Pauline 

Allen honored her sister, Varona 
Taylor, with an all day birthday party 
at her home in Gorman. 

Janda and Billy Taylor had the 
beautiful cake made. It was choco-
late with pink roses and green 
leaves. It was served following the 
bountiful noon meal. 

Varona received many beautiful 
and useful gifts and cards. 

Those sharing in the special 
occasion were honroee, Varona, 
Bonnie Cox, Billy, Steve amd Tracey 
Taylor, Brad, Paula, Scott, Kevin 
and Meagan Lewis, Nancy Hen-
dricks, Ashley Jenkins and Pauline 
Allen. Due to a suddt_ illness, Janda 
Taylor was unable to attend. 

On Thursday morning Bro. C. M. 
Avery of Shinoak Springs Mission 
brought the devotional for 21 resi-
dents. 

Those visiting Dee Gilmore and 
Emma Shugart were 'dell Warren, 
Modess Burgess, Lee Ann Shugart 
and Bud Shugart of Strawn. 

The May birthday party will be 
Thursday. May 30th at 2 p. m. 
Honorees are Junior Fairbetter, 
Gertie Leeper and Dorothy Beaty. 

Those coming for the musical 
Friday were Raymond Hart and 
Dewey Bailey. We sure liked the 
music. 

Lenis Rice and Nancy Hendricks 
helped with bingo on Friday. Win-
ners were Ora Mae Atchison, Gertie 
Leeper, Veno Hale. Dorothy Beaty, 
Emma Shugart, S. D. Gilmore, Mae 
Quinn, Ruby Vandergriff, Cynthia 
Earles, Iola Johnson and Ida Lewis. 

On Saturday Bro Joe O'Neal and 
Rev. Joyce Dennis held church 
services for 21 residents. 

Those visiting Jim Hogan were 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Freed, Ella Mae 
Hogan, Bob Hogan, C. 0. Sandlin, 
Cricket Walker, Dale and Nancy 
Jackson, Darla and Andrew Dale of 
Carbon, Carley Freed of Stephenville 
Ronnie May of Georgia, Paula 
Moffett and Virginia Welch Double- 

• 
Gorman Primitive Baptist Church has Services on 2nd - 3rd -
4th Sundays. Services begin at 10:30 a.m. Elder Barry Brown, 
Pastor - Everyone Welcome To Attend. 

The Order of the Eastern Star holds its regular stated meetings 
on the first Monday of each month at 7:30 p.m. - Ann jay, Worthy 
Matron - 734-2733. 

NANCY TROUT WILL BE IN GORMAN THE 
THIRD WEDNESDAY OF EACH MONTH 
AT THE CITY OFFICE TO RENEW AUTO 
LICENSE PLATES. HER NEXT VISIT WILL 
BE MAY 15TH FROM 9 - 12 NOON. 

Brent Foster will be appearing at the Cross Timbers Country 
Opry on Saturday, May 11th in Stephenville. Make Plans to 
go and listen to Brent. 

Canterbury Villa of Gorman is please to announce that the 80 
hour Nursing Assistant Training Program will be starting on May 
20, 1991. The program is approved for Nurse Aide Training by the 
Texas Department of Health. Upon class completion, students 
are eligible to take the proficiency and written examination 
required for placement on the nurse aide registry. Cost of the 
course is $176.00 per person. Class size is limited. For more 
information, please call 734-2202. The teacher for the Course will 
be Faye Scitern Gaeta. 

NOTICE!!! 
Anyone knowing the where abouts of any member of the 
Class of 1941, please contact one of the following: 

Margaret (Jackson) Sloan, 162 Melmont Ct., 
Granbury, Tx 76048 - Phone 817-573-6277 or Allene 
(Beaty) Boen, 706 Rusk, De Leon, Texaas 76444  - Phone 
817-893-2343, 
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Citizens State Bank 
PO Box 519 
Gorman, Texas 
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Joe Fields and daughter, Falyn of 
Bryan, arrived on Friday for a few 
days visit with his parents, Vernon 
and Deon Fields, and a brother, 
Lindell. Richard, Teresa, Taylor and 
Frevis Nachtigall of Morgan Mill 
also visited during the weekend. 
Other recent visitors with the Fields-
es were Jeff and Sarah Fields of Big 
Spring, Harvey Winn of Odessa and 
Lance Winn of Arlington. 

Roy, Sylvia and Yancy Buchanan 
of Clyde and Kelly Buchanan of Fort 
Hood visited on Thursday with 
Nancy Hendricks and they all met 
Wilbourne and Martha Wood of 
Carbon and Bill abd Doris Bradshaw 
of Gorman at the Catfish Corner at 
Carbon for a welcome home celebra-
tion supper for Kelly who just 
recently returned from Saudi Arabia. 

Nancy Hendricks visited in Clyde 
on Saturday night and Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buchanan and 
Yancy and Kelly, who was on leave 
from Fort Hood. Josh, Shirley and 
Tiffany Buchanan of Bowie joined 
them and they all attended the "Bull 
Dog Bash" barbecue recognizing the 
athletes of Clyde High School on 
Saturday night. Yancy was recogniz-
ed for his basketball and tennis 
playing. Yance was named to the 
All-District Basketball team. 

Clifton Thompson of Ogden, Utah, 
Ross Thompson of El Paso, Bill 
Thompson and daugher, Kim of Fort 
Worth, Bob and Gloria Pettit of Fort 
Worth, Della Moreland of Lubbock, 
Ruby Johnson of Bisbee, Ariz. and 
Nelma Murdoch of Phoenix, Ariz. 
visited with Glenn and Zelda Jordan 
on Saturday afternoon following the 
Kokomo Homecoming. Clifton. Ross 
Bill, Gloria and Della are the 
children of the late Alton and Ethel 
Thompson who lived neighbors to 
the Jim Jordan family sevveral years 
ago here at Kokomo. Clifton and 
Glenn Jordan went through school 
from first grade through graduation 
at Carbon High School together. 
Clifton also enjoyed a visit with their 
first grade teacher, Berneice Tim-
mons Rodgers. Runy Johnson is an 
aunt of the Thompson family and 
met them here for a family get-to-
gether. Nelma Murdoch drove Mrs. 
Johnson here. 

We express sincere sympathy to 
the family of Mrs. Ned (Bessie) 
Morris, who was bruied in graveside 
rites at Carbon on Monday. Bill and 
Wynelle Brown and Glenn and Zelda 
Jordan were among those visiting 
with jerrell and Bettye Johnson and 
family and Virginia and Yvonne and 
their families at the Edwards Funer-
al Home in Eastland on Sunday 
evening. 

We send get well wishes to Alvis 
Scitern who was injured in a farm 
related accident on Friday. He was in 
the Eastland Memorial Hospital. We 
hope that he is able to come home 
very soon. 
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NEED HELP??? 
We would like to invite your to join our OPEN NARCOTICS 
ANONYMOUS meetings. Meetings will be held at the old Fire 
Hall in Gorman at 8:00 p.m. on Tuesday nights. 

Gorman PTO is accepting Donations for the Louise Rankin 
Memorial Library. If you would like to make a Donation in 
Memory of or In Honor of Someone, Please Call Janda Taylor 
at 734-2497 or 734-2617. 

Gorman Masonic Lodge No. 716 A.F. & A.M. Regular stated meetings 
are 2nd Tuesday of each month at 7:30 p.m. Members are urged to attend. 
Visitors are always welcome, Bill Hagood, W.M., 734-2724 - Howard 
Hagood, Sec. 734-2977. 

The Gorman Support Group is now meeting at the City Hall on 
Wednesday nights at 7:30 p.m. Anyone needing support may 
contact Ina & Gerald Scitern at 734-2720 or Joy Campbell at 
734-2121. 
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10. Intangible assets 	  

11. Other assets 

12. a. Total assets (sum of items 1 through 11) 	  

b. Loans deterred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823 (D 	  

216 12 a 

N/A  12.b 

216 12.c. c. Total assets and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823a) (sum of items 12,a and 12.b) 	 

LIABILITIES 

13. Deposits: a. In domestic offices 	  

(1) Noninterest-bearing 	  

(2) Interest - bearing 	  

b. In foreign offices. Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and IBFs 	  

(1) Noninterest - bearing 

(2) Interest-bearing 
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13.a.  

13.a.(1) 

13.a.(2) 

13.b.  

13.b.(1) 

13.b.(2) 

51 1 2 HOME BOX OFFICE 
3 USA 	USA Network 
4 CNN 	Consumer New and Business Channel 
5 KXAS Fort Worth ( NBC ) 
6 ESPN 
7 TDC 	The Discovery Channel 
8 WFAA Dallas ( ABC ) 
9 TWC The Weather Channel 
10 KTAB Abilene ( CBS ) 
11 Fox 	FoxNET 
12 TNN 	The Nashville Network 
13 KERA Dallas ( PBS ) 
14 ENCORE 
15 WTBS Atlanta Superstation ( IND ) 
16 TNT 	Turner Network Television 
17 KXTX Dallas ( IND ) 
18 KDFW Dallas ( CBS ) 
20 CINEMAX 
21 KTVT Fort Worth ( IND ) 
22 KRBC Abilene ( NBC ) 
23 The Family Channel 
24 CNN2 Headline News 
25 CNBC Consumers News and Businness Channel 
26 Mind Extension University 
27 QVC 	The Shopping Channel 
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EQUITY CAPITAL 

23. Perpetual preferred stock and related surplus (No. of shares outstanding 
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b Outstanding 	 

25 Surplus (exclude all surplus related to preferred stock) 	  

26. a Undivided profits and capital reserves 

b. LESS: Net unrealized loss on marketable equity secunties 
27 Cumulative foreign currency translation adjustments 	  
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25.  
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28. a Total equity capital (sum of items 23 through 27) 
b Losses deterred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823 (0 

c. Total equity capital and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823 (1) (sum of items 28 a & 28 b) 
29. Total liabilities, limited - life preferred stock, equity capital, and losses deferred pursuant to 

12 U S.C. 1823 61 (sum of items 21. 22, and 28 cl 29 
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