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Rev. Quay Palmer 

tz:11 Revival At 

Flint Wilethodist Church 

Rev. Quay Palmer, a full-time 
Evangelist in the Methodist 
Church, and a member of the 
Central Texas Annual Conference 
will be preaching for the revival 
services at the First Methodist 
Church in Gorman beginning on 
Sunday evening, March 20 at 7 
p. m. He will preach each morn-
ing at 7:10 a. m. and each even-
ing at 7:30 p. m. 

Breakfast, consisting of bacon, 
eggs, sausage, hot biscuits, pre-
serves, etc., will be served each 
morning Monday through Friday 
at 6:30 a. m. 

Guest singers will assist with 
the music each evening Monday 
through Friday. 

More complete announcements 
concerning the revival will ap-
pear in next week's Progress. 

KOKOMO HD CLUB 
MAKES CONTRIBUTION TO 
SWIMMING POOL FUND 

The latest contribution to the 
Community Swimming P o o 1 
Fund was made by the Kokomo 
Home Demonstration Club. They 
gave half of the proceeds raised 
at a recent Stew Supper to the 
March of Dimes and the other 
half to the Swimming Pool Fund. 

The contribution was deeply 
appreciated by the Swimming 
Pool Committee. 

Funds are growing daily and it 
is hoped that construction of the 
pool will begin soon. 

Mrs. Gene Baker left Friday 
for a vacation and visit with her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Tom Reese in 
Costa Mesa, California. 

Non-Brainwashed Teenager 
I do not choose to be a com-

mon man. It is my right to be 
uncommon I seek to use the tal-
ents God gave me — not security. 
I do not wish to be a humbled 
and kept citizen by having the 
state look after me. I want to 
take the calculated risk; to dream 
and be able to put these dreams 
into reality; to fail and to suc-
ceed. I prefer the challenges of 
life to the guaranteed existence. 
I will not trade freedom for "a 
little temporary stafety." I refuse 
to sacrifice dignity for a hand-
out. I will always face dangers 
with bravery, and faith. It is my 
heritage to stand erect, unafraid, 
and proud; to think and act for 
myself, to enjoy the benefits of 
hard labor and toil, to face the 
world boldly and say. "This, with 
God's help, I have done, and this 
with God's help, I will do." 

(Wally Eater, a student at 
Evergreen High School in a let-
ter to the Denver, Colo, Post, as 
quoted in America's Future.) 
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THANK YOU. This is the first 
new press Kernel Gene has ever 
owned. During my 23 years in 
Gorman I have purchased several 
re-built and used presses. This is 
my first brand new one and I 
am proud of it. Each of you, as 
a subscriber to the Progress, Ad-
vertiser, or if you have us do 
your printing, has played a part 
in making it possible for me to 
purchase this press. I invite you 
to come by and see it and watch 
it run. 

• 
At the rate folks continue to 

give books to the Progress Li-
brary I am going to have to find 
a building for our library. Mrs. 
T. W. Stinnett brought in an-
other box of books. Took time 
this morning to glance through 
them and believe you all will en-
joy reading these books. Thank 
you, Mrs. Stinnett. 

• 
Nov that AFL-CIO has en-

dorsed the Houston candidate for 
Governor, I am fully convinced 
that Governor Connally should 
have another term. The principles 
of union are fine but I never have 
cared for dictatorship. According 
to some of the top union leaders, 
they are going to run this coun-
try or else. 

I also believe Senator Tower 
is doing his best to serve the 
people of Texas and not just a 
chosen few. 

• 
Tickets are now on sale for an 

Appreciation Dinner honoring 
Congressman Omar Burleson. 
The dinner will be held in East-
land, at 7 p. m. Saturday, March 
26th in their new Elementary 

• School Cafeteria. Check Smith is 
handling the ticket sales in Gor-
man. Full details will be an-
nounced next week. 

0 
Jug Dennis told me the Brown 

Jug would be closed on Sundays 
until further notice. Hallmark 
doesn't open until 11 a. m. on 
Sundays and Jerry Mehaffey us-
ually gets down around 9:30 or 
10 o'clock. 

I usually get to the office a-
round 6 or 6:30. So, I have ar-
ranged to borrow Jerry's coffee 
pot and all you early morning 
coffee sippers come on in and 
make yourself at home. Do-nuts 
while they last. 

• 
A large representation of Gor-

man folks are expected to attend 
the Battle of Songs in Fort Worth 
at the Will Rogers Coliseum to 
enjoy an evening of gospel quar-
tet singing. On the program will 
be The Blackwood Bros., States-
men Quartet with Hovie Lister, 
The Spear Family and the Oak-
ridge Quartet. The date is Satur-
day night, March 12, at 8 p. m. 
Thirty-seven Gorman people at-
tended the previous concert in 
Fort Worth in February. 

• 
Everybody pays the fiddler to- 

day, whether they dance or not. 
(or fish). 

• 
The following was sent in by 

a Progress subscriber: 

By KERNEL GENE, aPe • 

Oriental setting forms the background for Oriental Garden 
Banquet at First Baptist Church for Youth, Teachers and 
Sponsors. Left to right are Mrs. 0. R. Buchanan, Mrs. D. R. 
Clark, Mrs. J. E. Lawrence and Mrs. Frankie Jo Harper. 

Three of the young people who enjoyed the Far East setting 
at the local banquet are Burma Broom, David Armstrong and 
Debra Smith. 
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PANTHERS IN FAST COMPANY AT 
SANTA ANNA: NEXT MEET MAR 12 

OPEN HOUSE AT' 
DEADLINE FOR TM 
REGISTRATION OF 

LOCAL SCHOOL VOTERS MARCH 11 

SET TONIGHT 
Open House and Visitation 

Night Thursday evening, tonight, 
will climax a week of activities 
at the Gorman Public Schools in 
observance of Public Schools 
Week, March 7-11. 

The Open House and Visitation 
Night has been very popular with 
the students and parents in the 
past as it seems to afford oppor-
tunity of many parents to at-
tend due to most of them work-
ing during the day. 

Refreshments will be served in 
the Cafeteria following visitation 
of class rooms. 

Mr. Clyde S. Badgett, Unit Manager, Brandtjen Kluge, Inc., 
and James D. McKee, Service Man, explaining to LieuteNUT 
Joe Bennett features of the new printing press installed in 
the Progress last Friday. 

Texas' 15-day Voter Registra-
tion began Thursday, March 3, 
and the deadline for registration 
is Thursday, March 17. 

The special free registration 
period was brought about when 
a Federal Court ruled that Texas' 
poll tax voting requirement was 
unconstitutional. 

People who have paid their 
current poll tax do not have to 
re-register. But persons that did 
not pay their poll tax have until 
March 17 in which to register. 
All persons between the age of 
21 and 59 who have not paid their 
poll tax may register to vote. 
Persons 60 or older receive an 
exemption and do not have to 
register in Eastland County. 

Registration blanks are avail-
able at the Progress office or at 
Todd's Variety Store, which may 
be filled out and mailed or taken 
to the County Tax Assessor's 
office. 

The winning times were: 
440 yd. Sprint Relay - meet 

time 44.6 sec. - Gorman's time 
47 seconds. 

880 yard Dash - meet time 
2:00.3 sec. - Gorman 2:09.1 sec. 

120 yard High Hurdles - meet 
time 17.3 seconds. 

100 yard Dash - meet time 10.3 
seconds - Gorman 11 seconds. 

180 yard Low Hurdles - meet 
time 23.3 seconds - Gorman 24.4. 

220 yard Dash - meet time 23.1 
seconds - Gorman 25.8 seconds. 

440 yard Dash - meet time 53 
seconds. 

Mile Run - meet time 5:02.5 
seconds - Gorman 5:20.0 seconds. 

Mile Relay - meet time 3.35 
seconds. 

Six boys represented Gorman 
at Santa Anna. James Jay, Bobo 
Hunt, Jackie Harrison, Dwayne 
Snider, Bobby Williams and 
Louis Torrez. The boys did an 
excellent job, much better than 
Coach Smith had hoped for. 

The highlight of the relays for 
Gorman was Bobby Williams' 
fine effort in winning Second in 
the Half Mile. 2 minutes and 9 
seconds is an excellent time this 
early in the year. Bobby should 
carry the Red and Blue colors 
a long way toward the State 
Meet this year. Bobby is a only 
a Sophomore in the Gorman 
Schools. 

The other boys did an excell-
ent job last Saturday, and their 
times were as good as most of 
the other Class B Schools in the 
meet. 

The Gorman Panthers plan to 
attend the Richland Springs meet 
this Saturday. They will be run-
ning against Class B competition. 

ITEMS OF 
INTEREST 

Peanut irrigation 

Course Termed As 

Highly Successful 

Running against 2A and A 
Schools the Panthers were in fast 
company at the Santa Anna Re-
lays on Saturday. There were 
some 20 schools running into a 
30-mile an hour North wind with 
the temperature around 40 de-
grees. The times posted were fast 
this early in the season. 

FUNERAL RTES FOR 
ALVIN ELLIS ROGERS 
HELD IN RANGER 

Mr. Alvin Ellis Rogers, 80, of 
Ranger, died at his home at 430 
Hunt St. Friday, March 4th. 

Funeral services were held at 
2:30 p. m. Saturday, March 5 in 
Second Baptist Church in Ranger 
with the pastor, Rev. Robby 
Hobbs, officiating. Burial was in 
Alameda Cemetery under the di-
rection of Higginbotham Funeral 
Home of Gorman. 

Born September 25, 1885 at 
Victor in Erath County, he was 
a long-time resident of the Chea-
ney community and a resident of 
Ranger for the past 20 years. A 
retired carpenter, he was married 
to Lennie Jane Rodgers in 1941 
at Ranger. 

He was a member of the Meth-
odist Church. 

Survivors are the wife; one son, 
Alfred Ellis Rogers of Austin; a 
brother, Cicero Rogers of Chea-
ney; one sister, Mrs. Myrtle Lamb 
of Cisco; and several nieces and 
nephews. 

Pallbearers were J. C. Foriman, 
Buddy Rogers, Joe H. Rogers, 
Woodrow Wisdom, Reed Camp-
bell and H. L. Savage. 

The Peanut Irrigation Short 
Course conducted by personnel 
of the Agricultural Extension 
Service, Texas A&M University, 
in the Gorman-De Leon area last 
week has been described as high-
ly successful by those responsible 
for planning and sponsoring it. 

The course, taught by Mr. 
Wayne Keese, Agricultural En-
gineer, Agricultural Extension 
Service, Texas A&M University, 
and Mr. James Denton, Area 
Farm Management Specialist, Ag-
ricultural Extension Service, was 
held in De Leon on Monday and 
Tuesday nights, February 28 and 
March 1, with the site shifting 
to Gorman for the two conclud-
ing nights, March 3 and 4. 

Registration figures reflected 
an average attendance of approx-
imately 150 persons at each of 
the meetings which is a fairly ac-
curate. barometer of interest 
shown in peanut irrigation in this 
area. Growers attended from a-
bout all communities in Coman-
che and Eastland counties. An-
other indication of the interest 
in the course was the fact that 
only a very small number of 
those attending the first session 
failed to attend all sessions. 

During the first three nights 
of the course Mr. Keese covered 
pertinent data pertaining to ir-
rigation wells, drilling and cas-
ing, developing and testing. He 
also discussed the selection of the 
proper irrigation pump for the 
capacity of the well and other 
related factors. 

Two More Candidates 

File Fcr Places On 

April 5 Oily Ballot 
Two more candidates are in the 

race for the City Council. In-
cumbent Commissioner J. Davis 
Smith has filed for Mayor and 
Oda Monroe is seeking a first 
term as Commissioner. He filed 
for Place Four on the City Coun 
cil. 

Incumbent Charles Underwood 
filed earlier for Place Two, and 
E. E. Todd filed for Mayor. 

Two Commissioners post and 
the Mayors position are to be fill-
ed. 

PEANUT TEAM TO 

TALK WITH COUNTY 

FARMERS MARCH 16 
Eastland County farmers will 

soon have a chance to learn the 
latest practices in peanut produc-
tion. A team of specialists from 
the Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice will be in Gorman at the 
High School Auditorium from 2 
p m. to 5 p. m. Wednesday after-
noon, March 16th. 

The team consists of Ben 
Spear s, Agronomist; Wendell 
Horne, Plant. Pathologist; Henry 
O'Neal, Agricultural Engineer; 
and Phil Hammon, Entomologist. 
The group will cover such items 
as fertilization, diseases, insects, 
uses of herbicides, and other 
problems in peanut production. 

The meeting is not intended to 
be a complete course in peanut 
production, but is meant to bring 
farmers up to date on the latest 
ideas, methods, materials, and e-
quipment. 

Every peanut farmer or person 
interested in peanut production 
is encouraged to attend. There 
will be a question and answer 
period after the program. 

FINAL RITES FOR 
PAYTON J. POWERS 
HELD IN DESDEMONA 

Mr. Payton J. Powers, 64, of 
Stephenville, a retired druggist 
and pharmacist of Lockney, died 
at 1:30 p. m. Monday at his home 
in Stephenville from a heart at-
tack. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p. m. Wednesday, March 9 in 
the First Baptist Church in Des-
demona with the pastor, Rev. 
Darrell Dossey, and Rev. Gene 
Hawkins of Lockney officiating. 
Burial was in the Howard Cem-
etery, near Desdemona, under the 
direction of Stephenville Funeral 
Home. 

Born in 1902 in Desdemona, he 
married Estelle Byars in 1945 in 
Lockney. He had operated a drug 
and pharmacist business in Lock-
ney for the past 15 years, retir-
ing last October due to ill health 
and moved to Stephenville. He 
had worked as relief pharmacist 
at Shelby Corner Drug in Gor-
man. 

He was a member of the Bap-
tist Church and a Veteran of 
World War II. 
Survivors are his wife; one bro-

ther, Sam Powers of Desdemona; 
four sisters, Mrs. Pearl Duncan 
of De Leon, Mrs. Ethel Quinn of 
Amarillo, Mrs' Xenna Watson of 
Fort Worth, and Mrs. Jane Terry 
of Dallas; many nieces and nep-
hefs, and a host of friends. 

Gospel Meeting At 
Church Of Christ 
Slated March 14.20 

The Church of Christ in Gor-
man announces plans for a gos-
pel meeting beginning Monday, 
March 14th and continuing thru 
Sunday night, March 20th. Ser-
vices each evening at 7:30, (Sun-
day night, 7:00). 

Brother Gary Adams, a former 
Missionary to Holland, now min-
ister of the Church of Chrsit in 
Cisco, and director of the Bible 
Chair at Cisco Junior College, 
will be doing the preaching. We 
are sure that you will enjoy his 
kind presentation of the simple 
truths of the Gospel of Christ. 

We extend to all a cordial in-
vitation. Bring the whole family 
and worship with us in song, in 
prayer, and the study of God's 
word. 

The time again - 7:30 p. m. 
faach week day and 7:00 Sunday 
night. 

Scottish Rite Lodge 

Honors Area Masons 
Members of area Mason Lodges 

and their wives were honored on 
Thursday evening with a fish 
supper at the De Leon Coffee 
Shop by the Scottish Rite Lodge 
of Waco. 

Those attending from Gorman 
were Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Todd.  
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Parr, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. A. Watson, Mr. and Mrs. 
W. C. Browning and W. V. Crews. 

The Gorman 4-H Club will 
meet on Monday, March 14 at the 
Fire Hall at 7 p. m. 

The Business Men's Club meets 
on Monday night, March 14 at 
6:30 p. m. at the Brown Jug. 

The Woman's Study Club will 
meet Monday, March 14 in the 
home of Mrs. Buel Bryan. 

The Board of Trustees of the 
Gorman Ind. School District will 
hold their regular monthly meet-
ing Monday night, March 14th. Under the general topic of 

sprinkler systems he stressed 
such items as application rate, 
system capacity, depth of water 
application, and uniformity of 
water application. He defined the 
different types of soil, the water 
carrying capacity, effective root 
zone depth, and field water ca-
pacity. 

Under the general heading of 
water management Keese ex-
plained factors relating to soil 
moisture storage and daily water 
requirements. Keese explained 
in detail how to determine the 
amount of water an individual 
system is epplying in a given 
period of time. 

The Drivers License Examina-
tion Representative will be in 
Gorman Thursday, March 17 at 
10 a. m. at the City Office. 

The Social Security Represent-
ative will be in Gorman on Mon-
day, March 14 at 10 a. m. at the 
City Office. 

Distribution dates for USDA 
Surplus Foods for Easltand Coun-
ty for the month of March will 
be as follows: 

Monday, March 14 - Eastland, 
Olden and Ranger. 

Tuesday, March 15 - Pioneer, 
Rising Star, Okra, Carbon, Gor-

man and Desdemona. 
Wednesday, March 16 - Cisco, 

Scranton and Nimrod. 

The Desdemona Senior Class 
will sponsor a Mexican Supper 
and Domino Party at the Desde-
mona gym Saturday, March 12. 
Serving will begin at 7 p. m. 

Admission will be' $1.25 for 
adults and 50c for children under 
12. 

The Gorman Rebekah Lodge 
meets each Tuesday evening. 

The Friday Afternoon Duplicate 
Bridge Club meets each Friday at 
1:30 p. in. at the Fire Hall. 

The Gorman Duplicate Bridge 
Club meets each Thursday at 7:3$ 
p. m. at the Fire Hall 

Boy Scout Troop No. 38 meets 
the second Monday of each month 
at 6 p. m. at the Fire Hall. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Todd were 
in Fort Worth attending Spring 
Market at Mornings Dept. Store. 

Mr. James Denton discussed 
the economic aspects of peanut 
irrigation after having done con-
siderable research concerning ir-
rigation conditions in Comanche 
and Eastland counties. He point-
ed out average costs of initial in-
vestment in installing irrigation 
systems. He stated that for an 
irrigation well with an output of 
100 gallons per mniute an aver-
age yield of 47 bushels per acre 
under irrigation will be required 
to return to the grower the same 
proceeds as would be provided 
for 30 bushels per acre dry land 
yield. He covered average pro-
duction harvesting and fixed cost 
per acre. 

Ming trees, Oriental dolls, large 
fans and lighted candles. The 
place mats, napkins, plates and 
programs were covered with 
Oriental pictures. Chop sticks 
were found by each plate. 

To add to the Oriental atmos-
phere multi-colored lights cast 
their rays upon the walls, Orien-
tal, music played and beautiful 
ladies in Eastern Costume served 
delicious food. 

Pastor Huron A Polnac acted 
as Master of Ceremonies. T. H. 
Seay gave the invocation. Bro. 
and Mrs. Huron A. Polnac, Jr. 
sang, Bro. Polnac, Jr. gave a 
monolog and then Mrs. Polnac, 
Jr. delivered a challenging mess-
age. Bruce Hirst gave the bene-
diction. 

Sixty-eight Young People and 
their sponsors enjoyed the color-
ful evening. 

The annual Young People's 
Banquet is the First Baptist 
Church, sponsored by the Train-
ing Union, was in the form of 
an Oriental Garden Wednesday 
night, March 2, at 7:30 p. m. 

The Young People and their 
sponsors met in the Auditorium 
which was decorated as a Tea 
Garden. As they entered they 
were served tea and selected a 
fortune from the Fortune Tree. 

The group then made their way 
down a winding path, decorated 
with Japanese lanterns, miniature 
lights and wind chimes, to the 
Oriental Garden in the Fellow-
ship Hall. The walls of the ban-
quet room were covered with 
Oriental Mathis. Japenese lan-
terns were hanging from the ceil-
ing. Dwarf flowering trees were 
placed about the room. The tables 
were decorated with miniature 

Assisting Comanche County 
Agent Floyd Key and Bill Mc-
Cutchin, Ass't. County Agent for 
Eastland County (acting for Mr. 
J. M .Cooper, who was ill) was 
the De Leon Chamber of Com-
mrece, De Leon and Gorman 
Public Schools, Southwestern 
Peanut Growers' Association, and 
Gorman Peanuts. Those in at-
tendance on the final night were 
furnished a barbecue meal com-
pliments of Gorman Peanuts. 



LADIES! A FREE GIFT FOR YOU 

beautiful stainless steel electric coffee 
maker valued at S44.95 and dinner for 
yourself and three other couples 
absolutely free? 
No jingles to write nor puzzles to work. 
First 10 coupons received will qualify. 
Fill in the coupon and mail to Dept. 
XL5, Box 68. 
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Dept. XL5, P. 0. Box 68, Gorman, Tex 		t 

St. or Route 	  3 
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How would you like to receive a 

"Hey, Edicts, 1 Said `Help!"' 

Don't just just stand there getting squeezed — do 
something about it! JOIN 750,000 other Farm- 
ers Union members across the Nation to make 
your voice heard in Washington! 

JOIN THE TEXAS FARMERS UNION! 
The Farmers' Farm Organization 
Founded in Point, Texas, 1902 

THIS ADVERTISEMENT SPONSORED BY THE FOLLOWING: 

Man has marked time in some way since the earliest stages of 
life upon earth. Generally, we trace the present method to the 
year 738 B.C. when legend tells us that Romulus introduced the 
Roman calendar. But, even earlier, the ancients had what they 
called a calendarium, in which the days were marked off in stone 
inscriptions. 
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School Honor Roll For 
Fourth Six Weeks 

FOR SALE — 1958 Chevrolet 4 
door Bel-Air V8, PG, Air, Radio, 
Heater, New Tires, one owner. 
Call or see Rev. S. A. Baker, 
RE 4-5546. 	 3-10-Inc Following is the Honor Rolls 

for the Gorman Schools for the 
Fourth Six Weeks period: WANTED — A good home for a 

four months old male kitten. Call 
Maxine Bennett, RE 4-5401 after 
5 p. m. 

THIRD GRADE 

A Honor Roll 
Joetta Bennett, Wayne Blair, 

Mark Eaves, Sherry Porter, 
Kathy Ripley, Charlene Self, and 
Rodney Warren. 

A-B Honor Roll 
Kris Brown, Mike Clement, 

Rickey Fuller, Mike Shipman, 
Lupe Torrez, Billy Underwood, 
Dean Weldon, and Elizabeth 
White. 

DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE 
M near as your nearest Telephone 

Telephona DIT 6-3303 
Hamilton. Texas 

First class renovating on mattresses 
We make new cotton, innerspring, 
and Box Spring mattresses. BARBER 
Mattress Factory. Ph. 5841, De Leon. 
Free Pick-up and delivery. 	fn 

EASTLAND COUNTY LIVESTOCK SHOW 
NEW SHOW GROUNDS 	 MARCH 17-18-19, 1966 

SPONSORED BY THE EASTLAND COUNTY LIVESTOCK 

RAISERS ASSOCIATION 
FOR SALE — Twin Beds. Good 
springs and mattress. Will sell at 
a bargain. Mrs. George Black- 
well, RE 4-2214. 	2-3-17p 

FOR SALE — My home. Two 
bedrooms, large den and kitchen. 
Large living room. J. E. Lawrence 
RE 4-5622, Gorman. 	3-10-fnc 

PROGRAM 
THURSDAY, MARCH 17, 1966 

10:00 P. M. — All livestock to be on the show grounds and properly 

entered in their respective places. 

FRIDAY, MARCH 18, 1966 

PRECISION SAW FILING 
Saws re-toothed. Hand, Circle, band 
saws and power blades. Every tooth 
+nada uniform, accurate, and needle 
sharp on our Folty Automatic Saw 
Filer. Mail or bring your saws to L. 

E. Capers. Box 402, Gorman, Tex. 76454. 
Repair service on all types of guns, 
electric appliances. 	 fn. 

NEED 
An Extra Key - Made While You 
Wait! Rankin Army-Navy Sur- 
plus. 	 11-29fnc 

FOURTH GRADE 
A Honor Roll 

Vickie Simmons, Vicki Hall- 
mark, Nanette Williams, and Bill 
Baze. 

FOR SALE — Three bedroom 
house in Cisco, good location at 
1309 Bliss St. 2i lots, large tile 
double garage, car port, cyclone 
fenced. Very reasonable. E. J. 
Stephen, 802 Lamar St., De Leon, 
Texas, Phone 4786. 	3-3-24-c 

WATER SOFTENERS 
Purification - Filtration - Removal of FOR SALE — Registered Angus 
limn, sacle, taste, odor & sediment. 
Free Water  Analysis, can name, vg„ Bull, 20 months old. B. E. Simp- 
ma72. Wilson Water Condition St-vice, son, Gorman. 	 3-3fne 
Comanche, Texas 	 8-13inc 	  

A-B Honor Roll 
Rickie Park, Laveda Scitern, 

Nancy Grady, LuKretia Couch, 
Kenneth Butler, David Shepherd, 
LeVona Highsmith, Stephen Stin-
nett, Vickie Harvey and David 
Moore. 

-REAL ESTATE — Ranches and 
'Farms - Ali sizes to buy or sell. 
Contact Ranch & Farm Service, 
Eastland, Phone MA 9-2131. Buck 
Wheat. 	 4-8fnc 

8:00 A. M. 

8:00 A. M. 

8:00 A. M. 

8:30 A. M. 

9:30 A. M. 

10:00 A. M. 

1:00 P. M. 

2:00 P. M. 

7:00 P. M. 

9:00 P. M. 

— Classifying and Sifting 

— Weigh Steers 

— Judging Dairy Animals 

— Weigh Lambs 

— Weigh Hogs 

— Judging Angora Goats 

— Judging Breeding Swine 

— Judging Fat Hogs 

— Judging Breeding Sheep 

— FFA and 4-H Livestock Judging Contest 

FOR SALE — Standard Guitar 
with Amplifier. Priced to sell. 
May be seen at Gorman Progress 
office. 	 3-3fnc 

"INCOME TAX SERVICE" —
See Speedy Clark at Gorman 
Progress office. Day or night ap-
pointment. Call RE 4-5410. 1-6th 

FOR SALE — 1956 4-door Bel 
Air Chevrolet. Allis-Chalmers 
feed grinder. J. W. (Dub) Brown, 
Gorman. 	 1-27-Inc 

FIFTH GRADE 
A Honor Roll 

Kelly Henderson, Patricia Hirst 
Jeanette Jackson, Karan Kirk, 
Sha Rogers, Rebecca White, and 
Gary Smith. 

A-B Honor Roll 
Christie Duran, James Jackson, 

Chester Joiner, Michael Moore, 
David Porter, Bernadean Reeves, 
Brenda Weldon, and Abbram 
Torrez. 

	ran= 

TYPEWRITER REPAIR — For 
All Your Typewriter, Adding Ma-
chine repairs and cleaning, or a 
new typewriter, contact Estelle 
Craddock at the Gorman Progress 
office, RE 4-5410. 

If you are serious about selling 
your Real Estate, see or call Le-
land Nabors, Realtor, Bus. Phone 
2371, Res. 4872, De Leon. 11-4fnc 

SATURDAY, MARCH 19, 1966 

8:00 A. M. — Judging Fat Lambs 

11:00 A. M. — Judging Fat Steers 

2:00 P. M. — Judging Breeding Beef Cattle 

2:00 P. M. — Load Fat animals and hogs to be taken to sale barn 
for auction 

4:00 P. M. — Start removal of all other livestock 

7:00 P. M. — Auction and presentation of special awards 

MATTRESSES 
Gorman - Call RE 4-5611 
New and Renovate 
Choice of Firmness 
Choice of Ticking 
New Innerspring Unit 
Cleaned, Felted Cotton 
New Mattress Guarantee 

REAL ESTATE — If you are 
looking for the best in Real Estate, 
See Don Rodgers. 	10-21fne 

SIXTH GRADE 

A Honor Roll 
Mark Arnold, Don Porter, Dan-

ny Snider, Sharon Welch, Sarah 
Kirk, Denese Grady, and Bruce 
Smith. 

In 
• 
• 
• • 
• • A-B Honor Roll 

June Collins, Bobby Eaves, 
Billy Self, Windell Treadway, and 
Lorenia Turner. 

Western Mattress Co. 
Box 5288 - San Angelo 

STAR REFRIGERATION CO. 
Commercial Refrigeration, Air 
Conditioning and Heating sales and 
service. 20 years experience. See 
Roy Legg at Higginbothams. Call 
RE 4-5319, Gorman. 	11-11fnc 

See us for your Irrigation Needs. 
Complete line of pumps, pipe and 
equipment. Drilling and testing. 
Ardean Kimmell Irrigation Ser-
vice, Hwy. 6, De Leon, Phone 7191, 
Res. 3922. 	 11-25fne 

SEVENTH GRADE 
A Honor Roll 

BRYANT CATERPILLAR 
DOZER DESTROYED BY 
FIRE FRIDAY AFTERNOON 

A gasoline tank on a bull doz-
er burst into flames Friday about 
2 p. m. some two miles northwest 
of Carbon, resulting in heavy 
damages, according to Eastland 
Fire Chief Guy Robinson. 

The dozer, on the Bud May's 
place when the incident occurred, 
belongs to Adren and Troy Bry-
ant of Gorman. 

Tommy Bryant, who was oper-
ating the dozer at the time of 
the fire, believes that a collection 
of leaves under the seat was ig-
nited by a short or spark and that 
this fire ignited the gas tank. 

The dozer caterpillar is believ-
ed to be a total loss and is valued 
at $35,000. 

DESDEMONA NEWS 

The Desdemona Study Club 
had guest night at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. H. F. Wade Satur-
day, March 5th. One of the guests 
Mrs. Felix Sparks, gave an inter-
esting talk on their visit to the 
Alaskan Dog Races and also 
showed slides from Alaska. It was 
a very enjoyable evening for all. 

Mrs. W. H. Davis, who has 
been in the Strawn Hospital for 
the past week returned home on 
Monday evening. Her daughter, 
Margaret Henslee of Lingleville, 
has been staying with her. Mrs. 
Davis wished to thank her fri-
ends for their cards and visits 
and will appreciate friends visit-
ing her at home. 

Mrs. Ted Hall and daughter, 
Mrs. Brooks Wilcoxson, shopped 
in Stephenville on Friday. While 
they were gone someone entered 
Mrs. Hall's home and took her 
television and a collection of 
valuable guns. 

Mrs. Evah Sparkman was in 
Stephenville on business the lat-
ter part of the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Aaron E. Hens-
lee, Jr. and Suzy were guests in 
the home of Supt. and Mrs. Ced-
ric Bettis on Friday night. 

None 

A-B Honor Roll 
Anna Lee Butler, Tresa Duran, 

Hal Lasater, Betty Seaton, and 
Karen Hallmark. 

If you want a peanut farm, pecan 
bottom, a Texas Size Ranch, or 
a nice home, see or call Leland 
Nabors, Realtor, Phone 2371 or 
4872, De Leon. 	11-4-the EIGHTH GRADE 

A Honor Roll 
Mike Duran, Randy Underwood 

Tim Porter, and David Arm- 
strong. 

A-B Honor Roll 
Bill Kirk, Kathy Wright, Sherry 

Jobe, Terri Prater, and Teddy 
Jordan. 

HIGH SCHOOL 

A Honor Roll 
Mack Sutton, Glenda Jordan, 

Joyce Joiner, Elizabeth Parr, 
Mary Kirk and Doyle Shipman. 

A-B Honor Roll 
Anita Acrea, Marilyn Shell, 

Robert Whitt, Sharon Young, 
Brenda Shugart, Brenda Butler, 
Burl Harper, Randy Ormsby, 
Robert Ervin, Robert Reeves, and 
Dwayne Snider. 

endar by borrowing the Egyptian 
fixed solar calendar of 365 days. 
An additional day was intercal-
ated every fourth year to com-
plete the 3651/4  days. 

The Gregorian calendar can be 
traced to 1582, when Pope Gre-
gory XII "rectified" the difference 
by dropping ten days to have the 
equinox fall on the approximate 
date it fell on in 325 A.D., at the 
Council of Nicea. The revision 
did not involve any change in 
the weekly cycle, as Thursday, 
October 4 of the Julian calendar 
was followed by Friday, October 
15 of the Gregorian. 

The Gregorian calendar was 
first put into use in Roman 
Catholic countries, later by Prot-
estant and subsequently Greek 
Catholic countries, eventually uni-
versally adopted. 

The Gregorian calendar is not 
perfect, yet experts estimate it 
will be accurate, at least, until 
2500 A.D. Maybe by then some-
one will develop a perfect method 
of keeping time and in keeping 
in tune with the solar year, 
which actually consists of 365 
days, 5 hours, 48 minutes and 
46 seconds. 

Ruby Springer 
Income Tax Service 

Bookkeeping and 

Insurance 

RANGER, TEXAS 

New Location — 106 N. Austin 
Paramount Hotel Building 

Office Hours 
Monday•Friday 	9 to ..5 
Saturday 	  8 to 12 

Except by Appointment 

The months of the year have 
been named for gods, goddesses 
and emperors. March, for ex-
ample, was named for Mars, the 
god of war. May comes from 
Maia, goddess of marriage, yet, 
modern brides have made June 
the month for marriage, and this 
month was named in honor of the 
goddess Juno. 

Quintilis was the fifth month, 
as the Roman calendar began 
with March. To honor Julius Cae-
sar, quintilis was later changed 
to July. The Roman calendar had 
ten months. Others were April, 
from Aperire, to open, denoting 
the time the earth opened up with 
new fruit; Sextilis, which was 
changed to August; and our own 
September, October, November 
and. December. 

About 713 B. C., Numa Pompil-
ius added two more months, Janu-
ary, in honor of the god Janus and 
February, from Februalia, the 
time for sacrificing to the gods. 
This gave the calendar 12 lunar 
months, or 354 days, but the cal-
endar was at variance with the 
equinoxes. By the time of Julius 
Caesar, the calendar was two 
Months behind the sun. Caesar's 
experts devised the Julian cal- 

FOR SALE — Approximately 10 
acres, all or half with minimum 
down payment. Mrs. Bula Ste-
phens, 2121 Ridgeway St., Arling- 
ton, Texas. 	 7-1-27c 

FOR SALE or LEASE — 180 
acre farm, 80 acres grass, 80 acres 
cultivation. Located in Jewell 
Community. Joe Barnett, Gor- 
man, Texas. 	 1-27fnc 

HELP WANTED — Nurses Aid. 
Apply at Lawndale Home For 
Senior Citizens. RE 4-5720, Gor- 
man. 	 12-23fnc 

REAL ESTATE of All Kinds —
Farms and ranches our specialty. 
To buy or sell see us. Listings 
appreciated. Delton C o g b u r n 
Agency, Phone 4251, Hwy. 6, De 
Leon. Dwaine Watson, salesman, 
Ph. 356-2719, Comanche. 2-17fnc 

WANTED — Farm Labor, must 
know about livestock and ma-
chinery. Inquire at Golden Oak 
Farm, De Leon, or J. M. Caraway 
at night call 2818, De Leon, 
Texas. 	 2-3-10c 

WANTED — Insurance Agent to 
sell and service Farmers Union 
Insurance in Eastland County. 
For information see or call Oral 
Davis, Rising Star, Texas, Phone 
643-4586. 	 4-3-4p 

FOR SALE — The South half of 
our farm, approximately 106 
acres. Some peanut allotment and 
grass land. $125.00 per acre. See 
Mr and Mrs. Rush Crawley at 
1320 S. Seaman, Eastland, Texas: 
MA 9-2522. 	 4-3-10c Off. Phone MI 7-3230 

Res. MI 7-3237 

NOW OPEN 
GORMAN & SEAGRAVES PUMP 

& PIPE SUPPLY & WELL SERVICE CORP. 

arflattatMt=teatarraa=l—c.earc ' 

Dr. Fehrman H. 
Lund, Optometrist 
MA 9-1177 - 405-6 Exchange Bldg 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 
313 Main St. - RANGER, TEXA, 
In Ranger - 1 to 5:30 Tuesday: 

8:30 to 12:00 Fridays 
Closed Thurs. & Sat. Afternoon 

LOCATED IN OLD MAGNOLIA STATION BACK OF BANK BLDG. 

Authorized Dealer for Turbi-Flow Submersible 
Pumps & Redi-Rain Aluminum Sprinkler Pipe 

triconaimmall 

Ben B. 
McCollum Jr., DEM 

VETERINARY CLINIC 

STEPHENVILLE 
on Ft Worth Hwy. 

Service Day and Night 
WO 5-5217 - Res. WO 5-5218 

ONE YEAR FREE SERVICE ON ALL PUMPS! 

COMPLETE IRRIGATION SERVICE 

A. 0. Petty, President 
Phone RE 4-5756 	 Gorman, Texas 

E&G WELDING & MFG. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 

CHARLES DURAN 

ERICH ARNOLD 

WRIGHT IMPLEMENT CO. 

RANKIN ARMY SURPLUS STORE 

BROWN'S FEED & SEED STORE 

JAY'S GROCERY & MARKET 
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LINED PLASTIC 
DRAPES 

98, PAIR 

HENDERSON'S VARIETY 
Mr. and Mrs. E. G. Henderson, Owners 

HEADQUARTERS FOR 
GIFTS - TOYS & SCHOOL SUPPLIES 

DIAL RE4-5518 	 GORMAN, TEXAS 

For Best Appliance Buys See Our 

MARCH CLEARANCE 
ON ALL 1966 MODEL 

FRIGIDAIRE APPLIANCES 

COST - PLUS 10% 

BUDDY'S APPLIANCE 
GORMAN HOTEL 

  

PHONE RE 4-5610 GORMAN, TEXAS 

      

      

  

RAWLINS 	SINCE 1884 

Monument
s 

  

  

WEATHERFORD 	PHONE LY 4.2726 

  

PHONE FE 4.5363 
PHONE RE 4-5336 

MRS. ESTELLE CRADDOCK 
AGENTS 0. R. BUCHANAN 

YOU WHO WANT THE ELEGANCE OF THE NEW CAPRICE, 

YOU WHO WANT THE SMOOTHNESS OF A NEW IMPALA, 

YOU WHO WANT THE PERFORMANCE OF A NEW CHEVELLE, 

YOU WHO WANT THE UNIQUENESS OF A NEW CORVAIR, 

AND YOU WHO WANT THE THRIFTINESS OF A NEW CHEVY rilAkt  

COME ON IN NOW! 
CHEVROILD 

LOCAL POSTMASTER 
ATTENDS STEPHENVILLE 
MEETING FEBRUARY 25-26 

Graydon Baze, local postmast-
er, attended the National League 
of Postmasters meeting held in 
Stephenville Friday and Satur-
day, February 25-26. 

State President, Grady Martin 
of Silverton, headed the delega-
tion of approximately 100 visitors 
to the area meeting. Max Holder, 
State Secretary of Wingate, and 
several post office officials from 
Dallas and Fort Worth partici-
pated in the two-day affair. 

The area is composed of 375 
post offices served by Temple, 
Fort Worth, Stephenville, Wichita 
Falls, Abilene and Brownwood 
seciton centers. 

Registration for the convention 
began at the Interstate Inn Friday 
and resumed at the Tejas Country 
Club Saturady at 8 a. m. 

Business sessions were con-
ducted through the day Saturday 
by the area vice presiendt, Jimmy 
Carpenter of Comanche. 

Glenn Williams was host post-
master for the convention. Door 
prizes were provided by the Ste-
phenville Chamber of Commerce. 

Bags of roasted peanuts were 
compliments of Southwestern 
Peanut Growers' Association of 
Gorman. 

visitors at the Kokomo Baptist 
Church on Sunday morning 

Airman 3/C Dickey Eaves is 
on leave from the Air Force, vis-
iting with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R. C. Eaves, and other rela-
tives. He will report to Eglin Air 
Force Base, Florida on March 15. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Bryant have 
a new granddaughter. She is the 
baby girl born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Bryant of Carbon on 
Feb. 18 in the Blackwell Hospital 
at Gorman. She was named Kar-
en Ann and weighed 8 pounds 
and 2 ounces. Karen Ann has a 
brother, Kevin. Mrs. W. F. Bryant 
is the paternal great-grandmoth-
er. Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Hale of 
Carbon are the maternal grand-
parents, and Mr. Jess Hale of 
Gorman and Mr. and Mrs. J. 0. 
Warren of Cisco are the maternal 
great-grandparents 

Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Pittman of 
Fort Worth visited last week 
with Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Bryant 
and Mrs. W. F. Bryant. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ardith Pittman of Gorman 
spent Sunday afternoon with Mrs. 
W. F. Bryant. Mrs. Bryant is 
home from the hospital now and 
is feeling much better. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Briyant and 
Larry visited in Cisco on Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. Jess 
Hagen. 

ws..0-x-eirkete-troOx-47K0-040A49-e-0-)10s." 

THE REAL McCOYS 
By ROONEY WILLIAMS 

KOKOMO NEWS 
By MRS. GLENN JORDAN 

Mrs. D. S. Gothard of O'Brien 
an her mother, Mrs. H. C. Whar-
ton of Carbon, were visiting with 
Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Crawley and 
Mr and Mrs. Jim Jordan on Sat-
urday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Lasater and 
family of San Angelo visited over 
the weekend with cousins, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Lasater. 

Mrs. Jimmy Bryan, Liz and 
Susan of Houston, visited over 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Buel Bryan. They visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hendricks on 
Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Treadway 
of Eastland were visiting with 
the Glenn Jordans and Mr. Jim 
Lewallen on Wednesday night. 

Mr. Lewallen, who has been 
visiting with his daughter and 
family, the Glenn Jordans, went 
to Crosbyton on Sunday to visit 
with another daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jess Winn and family. He 
will also visit in Floydada with 
a son, Jamie Lewallen and fam-
ily, before returning to his home 
in Muleshoe. James was able to 
be moved home on Thursday of 
last week after spending 	six 
weeks in the hospital at Plain-
view recovering from injuries 
suffered in a car accident. He 
will be in a wheelchair for awhile 
yet. Mr. Jim Lewallen, who was 
injured in the same accident, 
hopes to have the cast removed 
from his right foot on Thursday 
of this week. Mrs. Jim Lewallen 
met her husband in Floydada on 
Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hendricks 
visited in Sweetwater on Sunday 
with their daughter and son-in-
law, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buchanan. 
Mr. and Mrs. Hendricks and Mrs. 
Buchanan visited in Roby in the 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Kiker and Becky. The Hendricks' 
also visited with her grandmoth-
er, Mrs. Fannie Maude Freeman, 
in Abilene. 

Mrs. F. C. Eaves of Gorman 
spent several days in the hos-
pital at Eastland last week. Mr. 
and Mrs. D. F. Eaves and chil-
dren and Mr. and Mrs. Paul Nor-
ris of Fort Worth visited with 
her. 

Mrs. D. S. Gothard of O'Brien, 
Mrs. H. C. Wharton of Carbon 
and A3/C Dickey Eaves were 

NOTICE 

In answer to the requests of the people we serve, we 

can now offer a pre-need plan designed for you. 

This plan was organized in accordance with the pro- 

visions of Chapter 512, Acts of the 54th Legislature, 

1955 (Article 458B, Vernon's Civil Statutes) and was 

issued Permit No. 197 by the State Banking Depart- 

ment. Funds placed in trust for the purpose of defray- 

ing funeral expenses are guaranteed safe by legal safe- 

guards, Heartland, and your funeral director. 

HIGGINBOTHAM FUNERAL HOME 
Gorman, Texas 

Now's the time to get just the buy you 
-want on just the car you want. Your 
Chevrolet dealer is celebrating Double 
Dividend Days—No. 1 Buys on 
America's No. 1 Cars! 

Availability and variety have never 
been. greater! Pick your model, pick 
your color, pick your custom touches 
and power. Get your No. 1 Buy now-t  
at your Chevrolet dealer's. Hurry! 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
This newspaper has been auth-

orized to announce the following 
candidates for public office sub-
ject to action of the Democratic 
Primary Election on May 7, 1966: 

For County Commissioner, Pct. 2: 
GLENN JUSTICE (re-election) 
DICK FOSTER 

For County Judge: 
SCOTT BAILEY (re-election) 
JOHN HART 

For County Treasurer: 
MRS. ELLEN JUSTICE 

(re-election) 

For County School Supt. 
0. L. STAMEY (re-election) 

For Representative, 63rd. District: 
JOHN E. MUSSELMAN, JR. 

BURKE MUSGROVE 

SAUL PULLMAN 

For State Senator, District 22: 

TOM CREIGHTON 
(re-election) 

DOUBLE IVI E DAYS! 
NOW AT YOUR CHEVROLET DEALER'S 

Always use that outside.mirror before pass ng. It's one of Cght 
standard safety features you'll now find on every Chevrolet. 

All kinds of cars, all in one place... at your Chevrolet dealer's: 

Chevrolet • Chevelle • Chevy 11 • Corvair • Corvette 

 

GM 

  

   

42-3317 

SMITH BROS. CHEVROLET Co 
DIAL RE4-2233 
	

GORMAN. TEXAS 

MR. & MRS. CHARLES BROWN 

B. S. DEGREE CANDIDATES 

Mrs. Charles Brown, daughter 
of Mrs. Dorothy Hatcher of Gor-
man, is among 43 Hardin-Sim-
mons University students that 
have completed requirements for 
B.S. degrees at mid-term. 

Diplomas will be awarded in 
commencement exercises in the 
H-SU Chapel Auditorium Mon-
day. May 30 at 10 a. m. 

Mrs. Brown, a 1962 graduate of 
Gorman High School, attended 
Tarleton State College, Arlington 
State College, Hardin-Simmons 
University and Abilene Christian 
College. She will receive a Bach-
elor of Science Degree in May 
from H-SU in Secondary Educa-
tion major in English, second 
field, Business and has fulfilled 
requirements for teaching music. 
She is working on Master of Arts 
in English. 

A member of Alpha Chi (mem-
bership includes only top 10% of 
students in nation) she is present-
ly teaching 7th grade reading in 
Franklin Jr. High in Abilene. 

Mr. Brown will receive a Bach-
elor of Music Degree from Abi-
lene Christian College at the May 
Commencement exercises. 

A 1960 graduate of Timpson 
High School, he attended Stephen 
F. Austin College, Arlington State 
Hardin-Simmons and ACC. While 
teaching at Trent Schools he was 
director of one of five Class B 
Marching Bands (1964-65) to re-
ceive a Class I Rating in Univer-
sity Interscholastic League March 
ing Competition and is a member 
of Kappa Kappa Psi, an Honor-
ary Band fraternity. 

He is currently resident man-
ager of the new American Motor 
Inn in Abilene while taking 
courses toward a Master's Degree 
at ACC. 

0 666 

WEEPING OAK 
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 
Dial 4281 	Be Leon 

SHOWING THROUGH FRIDAY 

RICHARD WIDMARK & SIDNEY POITIER In 

"THE BEDFORD INCIDENT" 
* * * 

SATURDAY ONLY 

DON MURRAY & RICHARD EGAN In 

"THESE THOUSAND HILLS" 
In Color 

—PLUS— 

MARION MICHAELS & HARDY KRUGER In 

"LIANE, JUNGLE GODDESS" 
In Color 

* * 

SUNDAY - MONDAY & TUESDAY 

RICHARD CHAMBERLAIN & YVETTE MIMIEUX 

"JOY IN THE MORNING" 
In Panavision & Metrocolor 

CISCO LOCKER PLANT 
We Sell Beef by 1/4  - lA or Whole 

We Sugar Cure and Hickory 
Smoke Hams, Bacons, etc. 
Butchering and Processing 

109 W. 9th St. - Cisco - HI 24377 

firing ShoeS 
For - the - family 

This Spring your family can walk out every day in 
fashionable good fitting shoes . . our New Styles, Tex- 
tures and Colors are here for every member from little, 
Sister to Mom. 

Come in and choose your family's shoe wardrobe. 

ZEKE.THs BEST PERTECTI ON 
Y.KIN GIT IS A POLICY WITH 

COLLINS & SONS 
AGENCY 

Mrs. Rooney Williams, Agent 

Phone RE 4-5411 	Gorman 

• o 

• DEPRFNENJ STORE • 

tiscr 
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For Your Irrigation Needs . . . 

See Us! 
WE HAVE PLENTY OF 

IRRIGATION PIPE 
& SUPPLIES 

Reda & Berkley Pumps 
Free Engineers Service 

CHECK OUR PRICES 
Before You Buy! 

TROY JOHNSON 
TRADING CENTER 

USED TRACTORS & EQUIPMENT 
USED TRUCKS & PICKUPS 

HWY. 6 WEST. 	RE4-2239 	GORMAN 

The Road Report . . .  AREA  

WHERE ARE YOU GOING? 

Automobiles provide us with the personal 
mobility to get wherever we want to go. 
The family car is driven an average of 
10,000 miles each year and most of these 
miles are short trips close to home. 

American Road Builders' Association 
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Isn't it time 
you gave this 
monotonous chore 
to an automatic 
Electric Dishwasher? 

BREAKFAST, lunch and dinner dishes. In-between-time dishes. Seems 

you're always washing and drying dishes, doesn't it? Why not make 

it easy on yourself and let an automatic electric dishwasher take over 

this tiresome chore? It cuts after-meal clean up time in half. You just 

scrape the scraps from the dishes, load and start your dishwasher, then 

relax or tend to other things while your dishes are washed and dried 

sparkling clean ... automatically. Sea your appliance dealer soon about 

an electric dishwasher—built-in or portable—that will help you Live 

Better Electrically! 

TEXAS ELECTRIC 
SCR VICE 	COMPANY 

T. J. HALLMARK, Manager RE 4-5514 

This Weekend 
Only $4.99 Each 

DRAPERY 
Remnants and 
Short Lengths 

ews From Lawndale Visiting with Mrs. Emma Ken- 

DESDEMONA 
NEWS 

By MRS. ETHEL KEITH 

Attendance at the different 
churches was up Sunday due to 
better weather conditions. 

Mrs. Avis Painter, the victim 
of a one car accident several 
weeks ago, remains a patient in 
the Gorman hospital, and is re-
ported to be improving. 

Mrs. Jolene May and sons of 
Houston and Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Arnold and daughters of Midland 
spent the past weekend here with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Arnold. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rodney Reid of 
Needles, Calif. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Williamson of Wichita Falls 
visited a day or two last week 
with Mrs. Myrtle Reid. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Burleson 
visited with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Russ Burleson. 

Mrs. 011ie Fein and her sister, 
Mrs. Bonnie Woods of Florida, 
who is here visiting, returned 
home here Saturday after spend-
ing two weeks at Silverton with 
a sister, Mrs. Milton Perry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Glasson and 
children spent the weekend with 
his mother, Mrs. Glasson, who 
was having a birthday celebra-
tion. 

Mrs. Ella Tidwell spent the 
weekend in the De Leon Hospital 
but was expected home Monday. 

Ethel Keith and her aunt, Mrs. 

The Church of Christ had 
church service at the home last 
Sunday evening. The singing was 
led by Ray Edwards. Everyone 
in the home enjoys meeting with 
this wonderful group of people 
from the church and are thankful 
that they have service at the 
home every Sunday evening. 

There were three people in the 
home who had birthdays last 
week. Mrs. Martha Arvin had a 
birthday on Tuesday, March 1st.; 
Mrs. Lucy Smith's birthday was 
Wednesday, March 2nd.; and Mrs. 
Allie Seay celebrated her birth-
day last Saturday, March 5th. 

Visiting with Mrs. Rebecca 
Shirey were Mrs. J. B. Johnson 
of Abilene, Mrs. Louise Roberts 
of Hobbs, N. M. and C. C. Camp-
bell of Cisco. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Scitern of 
Gorman visited with his mother, 
Mrs. Rosa Scitern. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Tunnell were Opal Hardin and 
Herman J. Hardin of De Leon 
and Mr. and Mrs. 0. L. Haney of 
Seagraves. 

Nathan Sherrard and Gregg 
Muse of Albany visited with Mrs. 
Elma Elliott. 

Lillie Ogle of Ranger visited 
with her mother, Mrs. Mary Ham-
ilton. 

Visiting with Mrs. Alma Craig 
were Neita Lee, Eva Wright, and 
Ethel Williams, of Gorman. 

Mrs. John Holland of De Leon 
visited with Mrs. Ada Kinney 
and Mrs. Carra Love. Also vis-
iting with Mrs. Kinney was her 
son, Mr. Henry Kinney of Stam-
ford. 

Joe Wilson of El Paso visited 
with Mrs. Helen Claxton 

Stella Park of De Leon and 0. 
L. Haney of Seagraves visited 
with Mrs. Fannie Welch. 

Evelyn Moorman of Denton 
visited with her mother, Mrs. 
Jonnye Burdette. 

W. E. Lane and H. T. Lane of 
Desdemona visited with Mrs. 
Beulah Lane. 

Jack Chaney, and the Bill Sher-
rards of Stephenville, were in 
Houston Wednesday to attend the 
funeral of Mrs. Mary Wilhite Neil. 
She was an aunt of Ethel Keith 
and a sister to Mrs. Chaney. 

The June Frank Eldridge fam-
ily of Lubbock spent the week-
end here with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. S. Eldridge. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Johnson 
were in Strawn Saturday and 
visited Mrs. W. H. Davis, who 
has been a patient in the hospital 
there for several days. 

The Johnny Dean Ragland 
family of Andrews spent the 
weekend here with his parents, 
the C. E. Raglands. 

Mrs. Mary Williams and dau-
ghter, Mrs. Bonnie Joiner, and 
sons of Kermit, spent the week-
end here with another daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Buckley, and 
Mrs. Williams attended church 
at the First Baptist Church. 

Visiting the Leroy Burlesons 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Reynolds of Cheaney. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Holder of 
Stephenville spent Sunday here 
with her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Moore. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman C. Warn-
ke of Austin announce the en-
gagement and approaching mar-
riage of their daughter, Carol 
Ann Warnke, to Jesse Tom Rain-
ey, son of Mr. and Mrs. H. M. 
Rainey of Desdemona. The cou-
ple plan to be married May 28 
at Austin. Miss Warnke attended 
Tarleton State College and was 
a member of the Owls social club. 
Rainey received his BA degree in 
government from Tarleton where 
he was president of Los Cabal-
leros and a member of the stu-
dent council and is now employ-
ed at Crown Cork & Seal in Fort 
Worth. 

Quite a number from here was 
in Strawn Sunday to observe the 
number of rattle snakes caught in 
the weekend snake hunt there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Moore and 
sister, Miss Lizzie Moore, visited 
Sunday at Buchanan Dam with a 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Moore. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Scarlett 
spent one day last week with 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Moore. 

Word was received here at 
noon Monday that Mr. Payton 
Powers had passed away with a 
heart attack in Stephenville. Mr. 
Powers had been in ill health for 
quite awhile. 

DR. W. H. STEPHEN 

,ZRIKIESI031.314monssaissma 

Visiting with Mrs. Ethel Ram-
say were Mr. Ernest Cogburn of 
De Leon, Mr. Henry Kinney of 
Stamford, Mrs. Millie Slaton of 
Breckenridge, Mrs. Willie Shan-
non of Throckmorton, Mr. Felix 
Boland of Scranton, Mr and Mrs. 
Otto Hageman of Cisco, and Mrs. 
Stella Carwile of Gorman. 

Out of town visitors were Mrs. 
Edward Roberts of Goldthwaite, 
Mrs. Lillian Bozeman 'of De Leon, 
Dan Martin of Eastland, Everett 
and Alice Harris of Rising Star, 
and Norah Murray of Carbon. 

Local visitors were J. W. 
O'Neal, Winnie Brown, Ina Mae 
Tarrance, Rosa Boucher, Eliza-
beth Simmons, Jessie Lemley, 
and Kate Love. 

DREAM GIRL 
HOSE 

400 NEEDLE - SEAMLESS 
60 GA. - 15 DENIER With Seam 

Now 59c Pair 

Madera Plaid 

GINGHAM 
65% DACRON - 35% COTTON 

45 INCHES WIDE 

SALE 98c Yard 

Early American 
Spanish - Italian 

LAMPS 
SPECIAL PURCHASE 

REGULARLY $8.95 

LINGERIE SALE 

GOWNS & SUPS 
BY MOVIE STAR 

WERE $3.98 TO $4.98 

Now 2 For $5.00 

HALF SLIPS 
BY MOVIE STAR 

USUALY $2.98 TO $3.98 

Now 2 For $4 oo 
BUY FOR GRADUATION 

& MOTHER'S DAY 

Free Gift Wrapping 

Come to SMITH'S & SAVE 

Sisc.E5INTRSTIP 
1/2  PRICE 	 1/4  OFF 

W. H. SMITH DRY GOODS 

ONLY 79c Yard 

Opened 

COUNTER SHOES 
Only $1.99 Pair 

Boxed 

COUNTER SHOES 
Only $2.98 Pair 
2 Pair For $5.00 

SALE TABLE OF 

FABRICS 

CAMPUS SHORT SLEEVE 

NO-IRON SHIRTS 
Selling At $2.98 

y..__  

Box Sale of Stedman 

UNDERWEAR 
Buy 5 of 
T-SHIRTS - SHORTS 
OR UNDERSHIRTS 

and get 6th one Free! 
•••••••••W 

Seven Colors of 

TERRY CLOTH 

Now 49c Yard 

Levi 

STA-PREST JEANS 

Men's Sizes - $5.98 
Boy's Sizes - $3.98 

FADED BLUE OR GREEN 
NO IRONING EVER! 

RAND & RANDCRAFT 

36 INCHES WIDE 

VALUES TO 98c 

WE GIVE S&H GREEN STAMPS 

Phone 2132 
	

De Leon, Texas 
Optometrist 

Thursday's in Do Leon 
Phone 4475 

GL 5-2444 	Dublin, Texas 

Home, Senior Citizens Mrs. G. C. Stacy of Desdemona. 
Tom Graham of Loraine visited 

with Mr. Hula Johnson. 
Mrs. Jack Thurman of Fort 

Worth and Mrs. Allie Mae George 
of Gorman visited with Mrs. 
Lydia Thurman. 

Visiting with Mrs. Emma Mc-
Keehan were Mr. and Mrs. Tom-
mie Conner and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Harrington of Austin and 
Ben F. Davidson of Kingland. 

Lenis Rice of Carbon visited 
with Mrs. Eula Been and Mrs. 
Rebecca Shirey. 

Mrs. Norman Jones, Kathy and 
Chris of Austin visited with Mrs. 
Virginia Griffith. 

nedy were Floyd Kennedy of 
Lovington, N. M. and Mr. and 

I 

NOTICE! 
Plenty of New 8 5!8 Inch Casing at $1.25 per ft. 

AUTHORIZED DEALER FOR WESTERN TURBINE 

AND GOLD CROWN SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS 

(Also RAPIDAYTON - GOULD & H.T.C. SUBMERSIBLES) 

ALCOA IRRIGATION PIPE — IRECO STEELUME COUPLERS 

REASONABLE WELL TESTING 

WE ARE EQUIPPED TO SERVICE WHAT WE SELL 

ARDEAN KIMMELL 

IRRIGATION SERVICE 
Phone 7191 	Hwy. 6 	De Leon, Texas 
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HALF SLIPS 
BY MOVIE STAR 

USUALY $2.98 TO $3.98 

Now For $400 
BUY FOR GRADUATION 

& MOTHER'S DAY 

Free Gift Wrapping 

DREAM GIRL 
HOSE 

400 NEEDLE - SEAMLESS 
60 GA. - 15 DENIER With Seam 

Now 59c Pair 

Madera Plaid 

GINGHAM 
65' DACRON - 	COTTON 

45 INCHES WIDE 

SALE 98c Yard 

Early American 
Spanish - Italian 

LAMPS 
SPECIAL PURCHASE 

REGULARLY $8.95 

Come to SMITH'S & SAVE 
LINGERIE SALE 

GOWNS & SUPS 
BY MOVIE STAR 

WERE $3.98 TO $4.98 

Now 2 For $5.00 

This Weekend 
Only $4.99 Each 

DRAPERY 
RAND & RANDCRAFT 

Short Lengths 	SHOES FOR MEN 

1/2  PRICE 

W. H. SMIll 
WE GIVE S&H GREEN STAMPS 

Phone 2132 De Leon, Texas 

Remnants and 

V4 OFF 

DRY GOODS 

DISCONTINUED STYLES 

Seven Colors of 

TERRY CLOTH 
36 INCHES WIDE 

ONLY 79c Yard 

Opened 

COUNTER SHOES 
Only $1.99 Pair 

Boxed 

COUNTER SHOES 
Only $2.98 Pair 
2 Pair For $5.00 

SALE TABLE OF 

FABRICS 
VALUES TO 98c 

Now 49c Yard 

Levi 

STA-PREST JEANS 
FADED BLUE OR GREEN 

NO IRONING EVER! 

Men's Sizes - $5.98 
Boy's Sizes - $3.98 
CAMPUS SHORT SLEEVE 

NO-IRON SHIRTS 
Selling At $2.98 

Box Sale of Stedman 

UNDERWEAR 
Buy 5 of 
T-SHIRTS - SHORTS 
OR UNDERSHIRTS 

and get 6th one Free! 

The Road Report .. • AREA  

WHERE ARE YOU GOING? 

Automobiles provide us with the personal 
mobility to get wherever we want to go. 
The family car is driven an average of 
10,000 miles each year and most of these 
miles are short trips close to home. 

American Road Builders' Association 
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See Us! 
WE HAVE PLENTY OF 

IRRIGATION PIPE 
& SUPPLIES 

Reda & Berkley Pumps 
Free Engineers Service 

CHECK OUR PRICES 
Before You Buy! 

TROY JOHNSON 
TRADING CENTER 

USED TRACTORS & EQUIPMENT 
USED TRUCKS & PICKUPS 

HWY. 6 WEST. 	RE4-2239 	GORMAN 

For Your Irrigation Needs . . . 

DESDEMONA NewsFromLawndale 
Home, Senior Citizens 

NEWS 
By MRS. ETHEL KEITH 

Attendance at the different 
churches was up Sunday due to 
better weather conditions. 

Mrs. Avis Painter, the victim 
of a one car accident several 
weeks ago, remains a patient in 
the Gorman hospital, and is re-
ported to be improving. 

Mrs. Jolene May and sons of 
Houston and Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Arnold and daughters of Midland 
spent the past weekend here with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Arnold. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rodney Reid of 
Needles, Calif. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Williamson of Wichita Falls 
visited a day or two last week 
with Mrs. Myrtle Reid. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Burleson 
visited with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Russ Burleson. 

Mrs. 011ie Fein and her sister, 
Mrs. Bonnie Woods of Florida, 
who is here visiting, returned 
home here Saturday after spend-
ing two weeks at Silverton with 
a sister, Mrs. Milton Perry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Glasson and 
children spent the weekend with 
his mother, Mrs. Glasson, who 
was having a birthday celebra-
tion. 

Mrs. Ella Tidwell spent the 
weekend in the De Leon Hospital 
but was expected home Monday. 

Ethel Keith and her aunt, Mrs. 

The Church of Christ had 
church service at the home last 
Sunday evening. The singing was 
led by Ray Edwards. Everyone 
in the home enjoys meeting with 
this wonderful group of people 
from the church and are thankful 
that they have service at the 
home every Sunday evening. 

There were three people in the 
home who had birthdays last 
week. Mrs. Martha Arvin had a 
birthday on Tuesday, March 1st.; 
Mrs. Lucy Smith's birthday was 
Wednesday, March 2nd.; and Mrs. 
Allie Seay celebrated her birth-
day last Saturday, March 5th. 

Visiting with Mrs. Rebecca 
Shirey were Mrs. J. B. Johnson 
of Abilene, Mrs. Louise Roberts 
of Hobbs, N. M. and C. C. Camp-
bell of Cisco. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Scitern of 
Gorman visited with his mother, 
Mrs. Rosa Scitern. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Tunnell were Opal Hardin and 
Herman J. Hardin of De Leon 
and Mr. and Mrs. 0. L. Haney of 
Seagraves. 

Nathan Sherrard and Gregg 
Muse of Albany visited with Mrs. 
Elma Elliott. 

Lillie Ogle of Ranger visited 
with her mother, Mrs. Mary Ham-
ilton. 

Visiting with Mrs. Alma Craig 
were Neita Lee, Eva Wright, and 
Ethel Williams, of Gorman. 

Mrs. John Holland of De Leon 
visited with Mrs. Ada Kinney 
and Mrs. Carra Love. Also vis-
iting with Mrs. Kinney was her 
son, Mr. Henry Kinney of Stam-
ford. 

Joe Wilson of El Paso visited 
with Mrs. Helen Claxton 

Stella Park of De Leon and 0. 
L. Haney of Seagraves visited 
with Mrs. Fannie Welch. 

Evelyn Moorman of Denton 
visited with her mother, Mrs. 
Jonnye Burdette. 

W. E. Lane and H. T. Lane of 
Desdemona visited with Mrs. 
Beulah Lane. 

Jack Chaney, and the Bill Sher-
rards of Stephenville, were in 
Houston Wednesday to attend the 
funeral of Mrs. Mary Wilhite Neil. 
She was an aunt of Ethel Keith 
and a sister to Mrs. Chaney. 

The June Frank Eldridge fam-
ily of Lubbock spent the week-
end here with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. S. Eldridge. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Johnson 
were in Strawn Saturday and 
visited Mrs. W. H. Davis, who 
has been a patient in the hospital 
there for several days. 

The Johnny Dean Ragland 
family of Andrews spent the 
weekend here with his parents, 
the C. E. Raglands. 

Mrs. Mary Williams and dau-
ghter, Mrs. Bonnie Joiner, and 
sons of Kermit, spent the week-
end here with another daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Buckley, and 
Mrs. Williams attended church 
at the First Baptist Church. 

Visiting the Leroy Burlesons 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Reynolds of Cheaney. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Holder of 
Stephenville spent Sunday here 
with her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Moore. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman C. Warn-
ke of Austin announce the en-
gagement and approaching mar-
riage of their daughter, Carol 
Ann Warnke, to Jesse Tom Rain-
ey, son of Mr. and Mrs. H. M. 
Rainey of Desdemona. The cou-
ple plan to be married May 28 
at Austin. Miss Warnke attended 
Tarleton State College and was 
a member of the Owls social club. 
Rainey received his BA degree in 
government from Tarleton where 
he was president of Los Cabal-
leros and a member of the stu-
dent council and is now employ-
ed at Crown Cork & Seal in Fort 
Worth. 

Quite a number from here was 
in Strawn Sunday to observe the 
number of rattle snakes caught in 
the weekend snake hunt there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Moore and 
sister, Miss Lizzie Moore, visited 
Sunday at Buchanan Dam with a 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Moore. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Scarlett 
spent one day last week with 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Moore. 

Word was received here at 
noon Monday that Mr. Payton 
Powers had passed away with a 
heart attack in Stephenville. Mr. 
Powers had been in ill health for 
quite awhile. 

DR. W. H. STEPHEN 
Optometrist 

Thursday's in De Leon 
Phone 4475 

GL 5-2444 	Dublin, Texas 

Visiting with Mrs. Emma Ken-
nedy were Floyd Kennedy of 
Lovington, N. M. and Mr. and 
Mrs. G. C. Stacy of Desdemona. 

Tom Graham of Loraine visited 
with Mr. Hula Johnson. 

Mrs. Jack Thurman of Fort 
Worth and Mrs. Allie Mae George 
of Gorman visited with Mrs. 
Lydia Thurman. 

Visiting with Mrs. Emma Mc-
Keehan were Mr. and Mrs. Tom-
mie Conner and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Harrington of Austin and 
Ben F. Davidson of Kingland. 

Lenis Rice of Carbon visited 
with Mrs. Eula Been and Mrs. 
Rebecca Shirey. 

Mrs. Norman Jones, Kathy and 
Chris of Austin visited with Mrs. 
Virginia Griffith. 

Visiting with Mrs. Ethel Ram-
say were Mr. Ernest Cogburn of 
De Leon, Mr. Henry Kinney of 
Stamford, Mrs. Millie Slaton of 
Breckenridge, Mrs. Willie Shan-
non of Throckmorton, Mr. Felix 
Boland of Scranton, Mr and Mrs. 
Otto Hageman of Cisco, and Mrs. 
Stella Carwile of Gorman. 

Out of town visitors were Mrs. 
Edward Roberts of Goldthwaite, 
Mrs. Lillian Bozeman of De Leon, 
Dan Martin of Eastland, Everett 
and Alice Harris of Rising Star, 
and Norah Murray of Carbon. 

Local visitors were J. W. 
O'Neal, Winnie Brown, Ina Mae 
Tarrance, Rosa Boucher, Eliza-
beth Simmons, Jessie Lemley, 
and Kate Love. 

Isn't it time 
you gave this 
monotonous chore 
to an automatic 
Electric Dishwasher? 

TEXAS ELECTRIC 
RVICCE 	COMPANY 

T. J. HALLMARK, Manager RE 4-5514 

I 	' 

NOTICE! 
Plenty of New 8 58 Inch Casing at $1.25 per ft. 

AUTHORIZED DEALER FOR WESTERN TURBINE 

AND GOLD CROWN SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS 

(Also RAPIDAYTON - GOULD & H.T.C. SUBMERSIBLES) 

ALCOA IRRIGATION PIPE — IRECO STEELUME COUPLERS 

REASONABLE WELL TESTING 

WE ARE EQUIPPED TO SERVICE WHAT WE SELL 

ARDEAN KIMMELL 

IRRIGATION SERVICE 
Phone 7191 	Hwy. 6 	De Leon, Texas 

WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES 

WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES • WASH THE DISHES* WASH THE DISHES* WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES WASH THE DISHES WASH THE DISHES• WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE D!SHES a WASH THE DISHES • WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES* WASH THE DISHES e WASH THE, DISHES G  WAN THE DISHES 

WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES* WASH THE DISHES•WASH THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES v' WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES WASH WE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES • WASH THE DISHES o  WASH THE DISHES • WiVid THE DISHES 
WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES 

WAS" w!•1E DISUS WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES0WASH THE DISHES 

WA 	DISHES*WASH THE DISHESe WASH THE DISqES‘tkrAN THE DISHES 
W/. 	DISHES t WAS!! THE DISHES 4 WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES 

ES*WilS:i rfi DISa»Soll!MH THE DISSES*VIASII THE DISHES 
SHES,WASH THE DISHES*WASH THE DISHES WASH THE DISHES 

BREAKFAST, lunch and dinner dishes. In-between-time dishes. Seems 

like you're always washing and drying dishes, doesn't it? Why not make 

it easy on yourself and let an automatic electric dishwasher take over 

this tiresome chore? It cuts after-meal clean up time in half. You just 

scrape the scraps from the dishes, load and start your dishwasher, then 

relax or tend to other things while your dishes are washed and dried 

sparkling clean ... automatically. See your appliance dealer soon about 

an electric dishwasher—built-in or portable—that will help you Live 

Better Electrically! 



MR. & MRS. CHARLES BROWN 

B. S. DEGREE CANDIDATES 

Mrs. Charles Brown, daughter 
of Mrs. Dorothy Hatcher of Gor-
man, is among 43 Hardin-Sim-
mons University students that 
have completed requirements for 
B.S. degrees at mid-term. 

Diplomas will be awarded in 
commencement exercises in the 
H-SU Chapel Auditorium Mon-
day, May 30 at 10 a. m. 

Mrs. Brown, a 1962 graduate of 
Gorman High School, attended 
Tarleton State College, Arlington 
State College, Hardin-Simmons 
University and Abilene Christian 
College. She will receive a Bach-
elor of Science Degree in May 
from H-SU in Secondary Educa-
tion major in English, second 
field, Business and has fulfilled 
requirements for teaching music. 
She is working on Master of Arts 
in English. 

A member of Alpha Chi (mem-
bership includes only top 10% of 
students in nation) she is present-
ly teaching 7th grade reading in 
Franklin Jr. High in Abilene. 

Mr. Brown will receive a Bach-
elor of Music Degree from Abi-
lene Christian College at the May 
Commencement exercises. 

A 1960 graduate of Timpson 
High School, he attended Stephen 
F. Austin College, Arlington State 
Hardin-Simmons and ACC. While 
teaching at Trent Schools he was 
director of one of five Class B 
Marching Bands (1964-65) to re-
ceive a Class I Rating in Univer-
sity Interscholastic League March 
ing Competition and is a member 
of Kappa Kappa Psi, an Honor-
ary Band fraternity. 

He is currently resident man-
ager of the new American Motor 
Inn in Abilene while taking 
courses toward a Master's Degree 
at ACC. 
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LINED PLASTIC 
DRAPES 

98c PAIR 

HENDERSON'S VARIETY 
Mr. and Mrs. E. G. Henderson, Owners 

HEADQUARTERS FOR 

GIFTS - TOYS & SCHOOL SUPPLIES 

DIAL RE4-55I8 	 GORMAN, TEXAS 

	

a 	 

For Best Appliance Buys See Our 

MARCH CLEARANCE 
ON ALL 1966 MODEL 

FRIGIDAIRE APPLIANCES 

COST - PLUS 10% 

BUDDY'S APPLIANCE 
GORMAN HOTEL 

CISCO LOCKER PLANT 
We Sell Beef by 1/4  1/2  or Whole 

We Sugar Cure and Hickory 
Smoke Hams, Bacons, etc. 
Butchering and Processing 

109 W. 9th St. - Cisco - III 2-1377 YOU WHO WANT THE ELEGANCE OF THE NEW CAPRICE, 

YOU WHO WANT THE SMOOTHNESS OF A NEW IMPALA, 

YOU WHO WANT THE PERFORMANCE OF A NEW CHEVELLE, 

YOU WHO WANT THE UNIQUENESS OF A NEW CORVAIR, 

AND YOU WHO WANT THE THRIFTINESS OF A NEW CHEVY 114 p)  

COMEON IN NOW! z N 	 
CHEVROLET)  

Dying hoe 
for -the-family 

This Spring your family can walk out every day in 
fashionable good fitting shoes .. o our New Styles, Tex. 
tures and Colors are here for every member from little 
Sister to Mom. 

Come in and choose your family's shoe wardrobe. 

Gorman Texas 

NOTICE 

In answer to the requests of the people we serve, we 

can now offer a pre-need plan designed for you. 

This plan was organized in accordance with the pro-

visions of Chapter 512, Acts of the 54th Legislature, 

1955 (Article 458B, Vernon's Civil Statutes) and was 

issued Permit No. 197 by the State Banking Depart-

ment. Funds placed in trust for the purpose of defray-

ing funeral expenses are guaranteed safe by legal safe-

guards, Heartland, and your funeral director. 

HIGGINBOTHAM FUNERAL HOME 
Gorman, Texas 

visitors at the Kokomo Baptist 
Church on Sunday morning 

Airman 3/C Dickey Eaves is 
on leave from the Air Force, vis-
iting with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R. C. Eaves, and other rela-
tives. He will report to Eglin Air 
Force Base, Florida on March 15. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Bryant have 
a new granddaughter. She is the 
baby girl born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Bryant of Carbon on 
Feb. 18 in the Blackwell Hospital 
at Gorman. She was named Kar-
en Ann and weighed 8 pounds 
and 2 ounces. Karen Ann has a 
brother, Kevin. Mrs. W. F. Bryant 
is the paternal great-grandmoth-
er. Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Hale of 
Carbon are the maternal grand-
parents, and Mr. Jess Hale of 
Gorman and Mr. and Mrs. J. 0. 
Warren of Cisco are the maternal 
great-grandparents 

Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Pittman of 
Fort Worth visited last week 
with Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Bryant 
and Mrs. W. F. Bryant. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ardith Pittman of Gorman 
spent Sunday afternoon with Mrs. 
W. F. Bryant. Mrs. Bryant is 
home from the hospital now and 
is feeling much better. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Briyant and 
Larry visited in Cisco on Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. Jess 
Hagen. 

THE REAL REAL McCOYS 
By ROONEY WILLIAMS 

ZEKE,TH• BEST PERTECTIQN 
Y'KIN GIT IS A POLICY WITH 

COLLINS & SONS 
AGENCY 

Mrs. Rooney Williams, Agent 

Phone RE 4-5411 	Gorman 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
This newspaper has been auth-

orized to announce the following 
candidates for public office sub-
ject to action of the Democratic 
Primary Election on May 7, 1966: 

For County Commissioner, Pct. 2: 
GLENN JUSTICE (re-election) 
DICK FOSTER 

For County Judge: 
SCOTT BAILEY (re-election) 
JOHN HART 

For County Treasurer: 
MRS. ELLEN JUSTICE 

(re-election) 

For County School Supt. 
O. L. STAMEY (re-election) 

For Representative, 63rd. District: 
JOHN E. MUSSELMAN, JR. 

BURKE MUSGROVE 

SAUL PULLMAN 

For State Senator, District 22: 

TOM CREIGHTON 
(re-election) 

WEEPING OAK 
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 
Dial 4281 	De Leon 

SHOWING THROUGH FRIDAY 

RICHARD WIDMARK & SIDNEY POITIER In 

"THE BEDFORD INCIDENT" 

LOCAL POSTMASTER 
ATTENDS STEPHENVILLE 
MEETING FEBRUARY 25-26 

Graydon Baze, local postmast-
er, attended the National League 
of Postmasters meeting held in 
Stephenville Friday and Satur-
day, February 25-26. 

State President, Grady Martin 
of Silverton, headed the delega-
tion of approximately 100 visitors 
to the area meeting. Max Holder, 
State Secretary of Wingate, and 
several post office officials from 
Dallas and Fort Worth partici-
pated in the two-day affair. 

The area is composed of 375 
post offices served by Temple, 
Fort Worth, Stephenville, Wichita 
Falls, Abilene and Brownwood 
seciton centers. 

Registration for the convention 
began at the Interstate Inn Friday 
and resumed at the Tejas Country 
Club Saturady at 8 a. m. 

Business sessions were con-
ducted through the day Saturday 
by the area vice presiendt, Jimmy 
Carpenter of Comanche. 

Glenn Williams was host post-
master for the convention. Door 
prizes were provided by the Ste-
phenville Chamber of Commerce. 

Bags of roasted peanuts were 
compliments of Southwestern 
Peanut Growers' Association of 
Gorman. 

SATURDAY ONLY 

DON MURRAY & RICHARD EGAN In 

"THESE THOUSAND HILLS" 

KOKOMO NEWS 
By MRS. GLENN JORDAN 

Mrs. D. S. Gothard of O'Brien 
an her mother, Mrs. H. C. Whar-
ton of Carbon, were visiting with 
Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Crawley and 
Mr and Mrs. Jim Jordan on Sat-
urday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Lasater and 
family of San Angelo visited over 
the weekend with cousins, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Lasater. 

Mrs. Jimmy Bryan, Liz and 
Susan of Houston, visited over 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Buel Bryan. They visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hendricks on 
Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Treadway 
of Eastland were visiting with 
the Glenn Jordans and Mr. Jim 
Lewallen on Wednesday night. 

Mr. Lewallen, who has been 
visiting with his daughter and 
family, the Glenn Jordans, went 
to Crosbyton on Sunday to visit 
with another daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jess Winn and family. He 
will also visit in Floydada with 
a son, Jamie Lewallen and fam-
ily, before returning to his home 
in Muleshoe. James was able to 
be moved home on Thursday of 
last week after spending 	six 
weeks in the hospital at Plain-
view recovering from injuries 
suffered in a car accident. He 
will be in a wheelchair for awhile 
yet. Mr. Jim Lewallen, who was 
injured in the same accident, 
hopes to have the cast removed 
from his right foot on Thursday 
of this week. Mrs. Jim Lewallen 
met her husband in Floydada on 
Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hendricks 
visited in Sweetwater on Sunday 
with their daughter and son-in-
law, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buchanan. 
Mr. and Mrs. Hendricks and Mrs. 
Buchanan visited in Roby in the 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Kiker and Becky. The Hendricks' 
also visited with her grandmoth-
er, Mrs. Fannie Maude Freeman, 
in Abilene. 

Mrs. F. C. Eaves of Gorman 
spent several days in the hos-
pital at Eastland last week. Mr. 
and Mrs. D. F. Eaves and chil-
dren and Mr. and Mrs. Paul Nor-
ris of Fort Worth visited with 
her. 

Mrs. D. S. Gothard of O'Brien, 
Mrs. H. C. Wharton of Carbon 
and A3/C Dickey Eaves were 

In Color 

—PLUS— 

MARION MICHAELS & HARDY KRUGER In 

"LIANE, JUNGLE GODDESS" 
In Color 

* * 

SUNDAY - MONDAY & TUESDAY 

RICHARD CHAMBERLAIN & YVETTE MIMIEUX 

"JOY IN THE MORNING" 
In Panavision & Metrocolor 
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R A W L I N S 	SINCE 1884 

onunnentS 
WEATHERFORD 	PHONE LY 4-2726 

 

PHONE RE 4-5367 
PHONE RE 4-5324 

MRS. ESTELLE CRADDOCK 
AGENTS 0. R. BUCHANAN 

1 Now's the time to get just the buy you 
want on just the car you want. Your 
Chevrolet dealer is celebrating Double 
Dividend Days—No. _1 Buys on 
America's No. 1 Cars! 

Availability and variety have never 
been greater! Pick your model, pick 
your color, pick your custom touches 
and power. Get your No. 1 Buy now—
at your Chevrolet dealer's. Hurry! 

DOU LE DIVIDEND DAYS! 
NOW AT YOUR CHEVROLET DEALER'S 

Always use that outside mirror before passing. It's one of eight 
standard safety features you'll now find on every Chevrolet. 

All kinds of cars, all In one place... at your Chevrolet dealer's: 

Chevrolet • Chevelle • Chevy II • Corvair • Corvette 
CHEVROLET GM 

423317 

SMITH BROS. CHEVROLET Cfl 
DIAL RE4-2233 	 GORMAN, TEXAS 
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Friendly Ladies Coffee 
Held In Green Home 
On Thursday Murning 

Seems like anyone ought to 
have time for coffee (or Sunday 
School and Church), but until last 
Thursday morning when the 
Friendly Ladies gathered into the 
home of Mrs. B. D. Green, there 
had not been coffee time since 
Christmas. And on that day, even 
a brisk sand storm didn't bother. 
Everyone does seem to enjoy the 
business and buzz sessions. 

It is the custom for the hostess 
to give the devotional, and Mrs. 
Green presented a delightful one. 
but, too, it was one containing 
some really serious thoughts. "Be 
still and listen," she quoted, and 
continued with this smiling, yet 
serious, remark, "God gave us 
two ears and onily one mouth; He 
must have intended us to listen 
twice as much as we talk." Mrs. 
Green went on then to elaborate 
more fully and develop several 
serious aspects of the subject. 
Just to think about - - Do we 
just talk to God and tell Him? 
(Well, probably not enough.) Do 
we listen to God? Twice as much 
as we talk? 

Mrs. G. C. Acrea, Class presi-
dent, conducted a brief business 
meeting. Previous minutes were 
read by the Secretary, Mrs. W. 
0, Parr, and the Treasurer, Mrs. 
Charles Day, gave a financial re-
port. 

It was noted that additional 
plates picturing the old church 
had been sold, but there are still 
some available. 

Mrs. Acrea adjourned the 
meeting with prayer. 

Business was brief; the buzz 
binge boisterous. Grape juice, 
coffee, assorted chips, nuts, and 
goodies added to the fun and fel-
lowship. Mrs. Erich Arnold join-
ed the group at coffeetime, and 
everyone was having such a good 
time that it was definitely past 
time to start cooking lunch when 
everyone finally departed. 

Randy Green was host for play 
and refreshments to Cheryl Arn-
old and Jay Black, little grand-
son of the J. W. Ramseys. 

a little high. Most recent shrine 
she said is the Little White House 
on the Perdenales. 

A salad plate was served dur-
ing the social hour. 

The club will again meet at 
the Brown Jug on March 22nd. 
with Mrs. Dona Moorman and 
Mrs. M. H. Fairbetter as hosts. 

JESSE PARKER ACCEPTS 
HIGGINBOTHAM POSITION 

Jesse Parker has accepted a po-
sition in the Hardware Depart-
ment of Higginbotham's. The 
position was vacated when Dick 
Foster resigned to become a can-
didate in the race for County 
Commissioner of Precinct Two in 
the May Primary election. 

Jesse has been an employee of 
Jay's Grocery and Market for the 
past eight years. 

Typewriter and Adding Machine 
Ribbons - Progress Office. 
File Folders, Letter and Legal 
Size - Progress. Office. 

Swingline Stapler and Staples for 
sale at the Gorman Progress office. 
Q Office Supplies, Printing, Nov 
elty Adv. Merchandise. RE4-5410. 

	

te'49" 	Sneezing 
A-A-A-A-CHOO! Pardon!! If 

you get an impulse to sneeze, 
obey it. Sneezing is nature's way 
of evacuating foreign matter front 
your breathing passages. Choking 
off a sneeze greatly increases pres-
sure in the air passages. If too 
much air is forced into the sinuses, 
it can do real damage. So protect 
others from your sneeze with a 
handkerchief . . . but NEVER 
try to suppress it. 

Irr,t  &ix 	 Tr 4e. • • Colds 	'' - 
t • 

, - The common cold is back again! 
Its calling card is a scratchy sensa-
tion in the nose and throat, follow-
ed by dull aches . . . muscular 
pains . . . runny nose . . . and 
sometimes elevated temperature. 
To fight the cold to a standstill, 
take a hot bath and drink plenty 
of liquids. Above all, GO TO 
BED . . . rest is vital to help 
your body fight a cold. Simple 
medication may help keep you 
comfortable while you, arc re-
covering. 

Tranquilizers 

	

. 	. 
Don't sabotage your health by 

experimenting with tranquilizers 
that weren't prescribed for you. 
Tranquilizers may help to relieve 
symptoms of some nervous or 
emotional disorder . . . but they 
don't cure them. You can suffer 
harmful side effects or mask a 
grave underlying problem by us-
ing another person's medication. 
REMEMBER: the tranquilizer 
meant for someone else's problem 
may give you a greater one. -, 
ISSUED MONTHLY IN THE INTER- I 
EST OF YOUR GOOD HEALTH BY 
THE NATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF 
BLUE SHIELD PLANS. _ „  

Wife pet he north 
votet Safi-  

Granted, you are doing a good job for your employer and thus are "worth 

your salt," as they say. Our question is: What kind of a job are you doing 

for yourself? Pick any date in the future. Will your financial worth 

then be commensurate with the money that you will earn in the years be-

tween? To get "Yes" for answer, "salt away" part of every pay check in 

your savings account here. 

%%SUR,' GoRmAn 
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Observes Texas Day 

Granbury Junior Club Chooses Mrs. Delmer 
Shugart As Oustanding Clubwoman Of Year 

Labor's New Goal; 
Secondary Boycott bor funds and help, has kept H. 

R. 10027 very much alive. 
The ensuing legislative battle 

will be between an apathetic 
public opinion and the strong la-
bor lobby. Political observers see 
it as a toss-up, with the anti-
Negro practices of some building 
trades unions as the possible de-
termining factor. 

the proposed bill would drastic-
ally increase the amount of time 
lost in strikes. Building costs, it 
is argued, are high enough. H.R. 
10027, there is general agreement 
among labor experts, would hike 
those costs even higher. In the 
long run this would hurt the 
present Administration's efforts 
to increase low cost housing and 
add new inflationary pressures to 
those already affecting the na-
tional economy. 

At a time of national crisis, it 
would bring new labor difficul-
ties to contractors working on 
national defense construction pro-
jects and slow down the produc-
tion of material vitally needed 
in the Vietnam war. It would 
also lead to serious work stop-
pages at missile construction sites 
which have already been hurt by 
too many crippling strikes. 

Like the thoroughly-defeated 
effort to repeal 14(b), the anti-
compulsion provision of the Taft-
Hartley Act, H.R. 10027 would 
have almost no chance of pass-
age if Congress voted its own 
views and those of the general 
public. But strong pressure from 
powerful unions, in an election 
year when many congressmen 
and senators are counting on la- 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Phone 2272 - Day or Night 
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The Excelsior Club met at the 
Brown Jug Cafe with Mrs. Nell 
Rainey as hostess on Tuesday 
afternoon. 

The program, under the direc-
tion of Mrs. John Kirk, was titled 
Texas Day. Members answering 
the Roll Call, A Prominent Tex-
an, listed John Nance Garner, 
Wm. B. Travis, Dwight D. Eisen-
hower, Governor John Connally, 
Congressman Omar Burleson, 
Senator John Tower and Presi-
dent Lyndon B. Johnson. 

Mrs. Lawrence Eison gave The 
Story of the Alamo and read the 
historic document, the "Letter 
written by William B. Travis 
from the Alamo." 

The letter was written on Feb. 
26th. and the supreme sacrifice 
was made on March 6th. 

Mrs. Walter Underwood gave 
a paper, "Spanish Missions to 
Modern Shrines." She said that 
Texas history could be traced by 
its buildings, the first mission 
being a church at the oldest town 
in Texas, Ysleta, built in 1682. 
Among others she named were 
Missions Conception and San 
Jose with the Alamo. She also 
said that the Capitol was built 
in 1882. Three million acres of 
land were sold to finance the 
building, patterned after the 
United States Capitol and being 

ADVERTISING RATES: 
Display, per column inch — 56c 
Classified Advertising - 3c word 

Minimum Charge - 60c 

suasemmos RATES: 

Eastland, Comanche Counties 

$2.00 per year 
All other subscriptions, $4.00 per year 

Service Men, Complimentary 

club activities and is employed 
at the Brazos Agency, she ful-
fills her duties and responsibil-
ities as a homemaker. She is an 
active member of the Church of 
Christ. 

Her husband, Delmer, is em-
ployed by the Hood County News 
Tablet. They have two charming 
daughters, Kathy and Darla. 

Ernestine is the daughter of 
Mr. E. E. Todd and granddaugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Todd 
of Gorman. 

Since she is a native of Gorman 
and grew up here we still con-
sider her ours and her friends 
are proud of her club work 
achievements and know she is 
deserving of all the honors she 
has received. 

This article was taken from a 
recent issue of the Hood County 
News-Tablet of Granbury. 

The Teen Scera Set 
Fir April 2 In Eastland 

CONTINENTAL 
WATER WELL DRILLING 
Complete Irrigation Systems 

and Service 

Having lost the battle to im-
pose compulsory unionism on the 
nation's employed, organized la-
bor has now retired to prepared 
positions in order to re-form its 
ranks and gebin a new assault. 
This time, its goal is amendment 
of the Taft-Hartley provision 
banning secondary boycotts in 
labor disputes. 

The immediate target is Con-
gressional sanction for on-site (or 
common situs) picketing of con-
struction projects. The AFL-CIO 
and its allies are rallying behind 
H.R. 10027, a bill embodying the 
hopes of the building trades 
unions for a powerful grip on the 
construction industry. 

Under the present law, unions 
cannot throw picket lines around 
a plant whose only offense in 
labor's eyes is that it is doing 
business with a struck plant. This 
kind of secondary boycott. Con-
gress felt, punished industries and 
their workers who were, in effect, 
innocent bystanders in the pri-
mary labor dispute. 

The building trades unions pro-
tested lustily. Since construction 
involves many different contrac-
tors and trades, however, allow-
ing the plumbers or carpenters 
to keep out the plasterers and the 
electricians from a construction 
site would bring hardship to those 
who had no stake in the particu-
lar labor management dispute 
causing the trouble. 

H.R. 10027, if passed, will per-
mit one union involved in a dis-
pute with one contractor to throw 
up a picket line around an entire 
construction site, thereby bring-
ing to a halt all work there —
and at any other site where the 
struck contractor is working. 

Opponents of this AFL-CIO-in-
spired measure argue that this 
would put enormous powers of 
coercion in the hands of the la-
bor bureaucracy and work a-
gainst the interests of workers. 
If H.R. 10027 passes, they will be 
thrown out of work at any time 
and forced into indeterminate 
periods of idleness. Contractors, 
no matter how good their labor 
relations might be, would be 
penalized for conflicts not of their 
own making. 

While giving virtual veto pow-
er to any building trades union, 

TURN KEY JOBS 

The members of the Family 
Living Committee are making 
final arrangements for The Teen 
Scene. In their meeting Friday 
morning, March 4th, they ar-
ranged for entertainment, meals 
and planned the schedule for the 
event which will be held in the 
Eastland Elementary School Caf-
etorium on April 2nd. 

The Teen Scene is for the high 
school students throughout the 
county and arrangement for at-
tending and pre-registration are 
being made through each school's 
F.H.A. Chapter. 

As plans progress, they will 
be announced by Mrs. Beverly 
Nicholson, County Home Demon-
stration Agent, and Wanda Wat-
son, Ass't. County HD Agent, 
who serves as advisors to the 
Family Living Committee. 

ROTARY DRILLING - AIR TESTING 

Reda Submergible Pumps - Alcoa Aluminum Pipe 

Sales and Service 	Completely Installed 

Jacuzzi - Red Jacket Pumps 

Weekend visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. C. S. Bohannon 
were their children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Neal Clark of Weatherford, Mrs. 
Jimmy Bridges and family of 
Gorman and Rev. and Mrs. Eddie 
Overstreet, Sylvia, Steve, Randy 
and Mike of Grand Prairie. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert B. Akers 
and Brenda Lea of Fort Worth 
visited in the home of his mother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Seth Bowles, over 
the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs Gene Snider and 
Kathy and Mr. and Mrs. W. C. 
Browning spent the weekend in 
Monahans with Mr. and Mrs. 
Woodrow Browning. 

Member of Lone Star 

WILLIAM E. MESSER 

DRILLER 

PHONE RE 4-5575 

The Junior Woman's Club has 
named Mrs. Delmer Shugart as 
the recipient for the Outstand-
ing Club Woman of the Year. 

Ernestine has served as Presi-
dent of the club for two consecu-
tive years, 1964-66. During her 
years in the club she has held 
the offices of Second Vice-Presi-
dent (Yearbook Chairman), Re-
cording Secretary, Treasurer; and 
is Reporter and Historian-elect 

f or 1966-67. 
She has held the Federation 

appointments of Junior Director 
Home Life Department for a one 
year term. Also, Junior Director 
Texas Heritage Department for 
two years. 

Ernestine has also served in 
the capacity of temporary chair-
man of the Hood County Cancer 
Society Unit until it was organ-
ized. She has served on the Board 
and is presently the Publicity 
Chairman. 

Through her efforts the Friends 
of the Library Club was founded. 
She was appointed as a member 
of the Board of Trustees. She 
holds the office of Secretary this 
year. 

The Jr. Woman's Club and 
other civic clubs have obtained 
many goals and carried out worth 
while projects because of her de-
votion and leadership. Her dy-
namic personality, thoughtfulness 
of others, and energetic ways 
have attributed to the love and 
respect given her by all those 
with whom she associates. 

Although Ernestine devotes 
much of her time to the many 

Water Well Association 

HOMER D. SANDERS 

MANAGER 

GORMAN, TEXAS 

Winter Clearance Sale 
1 0 % OFF 

ON ALL DEARBORN STOVES 

we make a deluxe gas heater. 

we call it 
the DELUXE 

I I 
Truly a DELUXE gas area 
heater! Built to give you 
years and years of quick, 
efficient, low-cost heating. 
It has the famous "touch-
cool" Cool Safety Cabinet, 
and Forward Heat Flow for 
fast, head-to-toe heating. 
See your Dearborn Dealer 
today. 

Dearborn 

STORE RE 4-5319 - LUMBER YARD RE 4-5419 

FUNERAL HOME - AMBULANCE 	Day or Night — Phone RE 4-2272 
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Fifteen visiting bands, made up 
of over 300 students, plus spon-
sors and parents, will invade 
Gorman Saturday, March 19 for 
the District Band Festival. 

Band students will be repre-
senting area schools of Brown-
wood, Stephenville, Bridgeport, 
Cisco Jr. College, Ranger Jr. Col-
lege, Breckenridge, Ranger, Cross 
Plains, Dublin, San Saba, Coman-
che, Rising Star and Gorman. 

Bands entering are Class AAA, 
AA, A and B. 

Activities will begin at 9 a. in. 
with bands playing at 30 minute 
intervals during the day. Presen-
tation of trophies will be at 5:45 
p. m. 

Judges for the festival will be 
John Giordano, band instructor 
at North Texas State University, 
and Curtiss Wilson, stage band 
director at Texas Christian Uni-
versity. 

Herman Alsup, director of Gor-
man Bands, is in charge of ar-
rangements for the festival. 

Gorman Band students will at-
tend Interscholastic League Solo 
Contest to be held at Howard 
Payne College in Brownwood on 
Saturday, March 12. Approxi-
mately 70 students will partici- 
pate. 

CHASE & SANBORN , 	1 lb. can .69 
of le e 2 lb. can 135  

Chicken-Hens  LARGI:eSia .39 
Picnic Shoulder nr::: 229 

SLICED 

303 CANS 

3 - 49 c 

300 CAN 

1o° 

HUNT'S 

TOMATOES 
300 CAN 

5-41 

BEETS 

FRES14...FRESM.. 

and VEGETABLES 
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Mrs. W. M. Hutkrieston Gorman FHA Chapter 
Mesterei On 9111. 	Mends Area Meeting 
BLelhday In De Legn 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., Texas, MARCH 10, 1966 School Holiday Slated 
Here For Friday 

Father Of Mrs. Crews 
Buried On Monday 
At San Angelo Rites Gorman Public School students 

will have a holiday from classes 
Friday in order that teachers and 
school personnel may attend the 
25th. annual convention of the 
Oil Belt District VII of the Texas 
State Teachers Association. 

Feature speakers during the 
one day meeting will be U. S. 
Senator John Tower of Wichita 
Falls; Dr. Lois V. Edinger, im-
mediate past president of the 
National Education Assn.; and 
Judge Harold Sam Kessinger of 
New Jersey, widely known phi-
losopher-humorist. 

Sen. Tower will address the 
teachers at 9 a. m. Friday in Rat-
ford Auditorium on the McMurry 
College campus. 

Twenty-eight speakers will ad-
dress various groups when the 
teachers split up for sectional 
meetings from 12:30 to 2:15 p. m. 

Over 3,500 teachers are expect-
ed to attend the meeting. 

"International Friendship - The 
American Way," was the theme 
for the Area IV Future Home-
makers of America meeting held 
Friday and Saturday at Tarleton 
State College. 

Those attending from the Gor-
man Chapter were Charles Ann 
Jenkins, Jean Munn, Connie 
Park, Lana Stacy, Brenda Butler, 
Faith Decker, Hope Decker, and 
Hanna Duske. They were accom-
panied by Miss Ragan, Home-
making Teacher. 

Two girls from the Gorman 
Chapter will attend. the F.H.A. 
meeting in San Antonio April 
28-29. It is not known at this 
time who will represent Gorman 
at this meeting. 

Approximately 1,40 0 high 
school girls and their advisors at-
tended the weekend meeting. The 
groups came from 23 Central and 
North Texas counties represent-
ing 100 high school FHA Chap_ 
ters. 

Stage Band Festival 
Draws 15 Entrants 

Mr. R. L. Thompson, 89, of San 
Angelo, and father of Mrs W. V. 
Crews of Gorman, died at 5:12 
p. m. Saturday, March 5 at his 
home. He had been ill only a 
short time. 

Funeral services were held at 
2:30 p. m. Monday, March 7 in 
Johnson Street Church of Christ 
in San Angelo. Burial was in Bel-
vedere Cemetery. 

A native of Alabama, Mr. 
Thompson had lived in San An-
gelo since 1940. A daughters, Mrs. 
Annie Whitaker, made her home 
with him. 

Survivors are seven daughters, 
Mrs. W. V. Crews, Gorman, Mrs. 
Mack Tate, Big Springs, Mrs. 
Annie Whitaker and Mrs. Stella 
Matejek, both of San Angelo, 
Mrs. Polly Camp of Portland, 
Oregon, Miss Tommie Thompson 
of Tulsa, Okla., and Mrs. Oudia 
Nesbett, Lubbock; two sons, Har-
mon Thompson, Slaton, and W. 
E. Thompson of Farmington, N. 
M.; 15 grandchildren and 18 great 
grandchildren. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Dial RE 4-2272 - Day or Night 

Band Boosters Call 
Meeting For March 17 
On Band Calendars 

On Monday, March 7, the Band 
Boosters Club met for their reg-
ular meeting in the Band Hall. 
The meeting was called to order 
by the president, Mrs. Charles 
Duran. 

All mothers who can work on 
the Community Birthday Calen-
dars will meet at Mrs. Duran's 
home on Thursday, March 17 at 
9 a. m. 

The next item on the agenda 
was the Stage Band Festival that 
is to be held in Gorman Satur-
day, March 19. The Band Boosters 
will operate a concession stand 
for the festival. Mrs. Edgar Hig-
ginbottom was appointed as 
Chairman of the Food Committee, 
with the following ladies on her 
committee: Mines. Fred Rogers, 
Dolsy. Underwood, Erich Arnold, 
and Lizzie Jackson. There will be 
approximately 300 students par-
ticipating in some 12 to 15 bands 
present for the festival. 

The Band students are to go 
to Brownwood Saturday, March 
12 for the Interscholastic League 
Solo Contest. The mothers going 
as sponsors are Mrs. Claude Full-
er, Mrs. Erich Arnold and Mrs. 
Frankie Jo Harper. 

Keynote speaker was Miss 
Helen Poe, world traveler and 
lecturer, talking on "Internation-
al Friendship - The American 
Way." 

4z %   42 %   only missed his great-grandmoth-
er's party, but his own birthday 
party next day, due to the chick-
en pox. Another grandson, Bill 
Huddleston of Houston, arrived 
Saturday to wish his grandmother 
many happy returns of the day. 

Three Applicants Sign 
For Nursing Program 

TORNADO 
TAKE WARNING 

NOW . . . INSURE 

TO BE SURE 

If you can save money, you are to 
be congratulated . . . 
If you save money, you deserve to 
be paid for it . 
It is our business to pay you for 
savings . . . 

4'2 % 	4 12 % 
STEPHENVILLE SAVINGS 

AND WAN ASSOCIATION 

Nature's violence can wreck havoc . . . but insurance 

can make sure you're financially protected against 

loss. And cost is low! 

SEE US, FOR SAFETY'S SAKE 

GORMAN INS. AGENCY PHONE WO 5-3166 

Stephenville, Texas 
Berenice Jeffs 

GORMAN 

Kermit, were weekend guests 
this week. 

Visiting in the home of Mrs. 
Neita Lee and Mrs. Alma Craig 
last week for the observance of 
Mrs. Craig's 82nd birthday were 
her son, Jesse Craig of Cedar 
Rapids, Iowa, daughters, Mrs. 
Clinton Gage and family and Mrs. 
Ida DeVoll, all of Fort Worth, 
and children of Mrs. Lee, Mr. 
and Mrs B. J. Ragland and fam-
ily of Maljamar, N. M. and Ken-
neth Lee of Woodson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Bennett and 
boys of Cleburne visited during 
the weekend with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Bell and 
Mrs. Ruby Bennett. 

Chas. L. Duran 

DIAL RE 4-5312 

Mr. Buel Bryan of the Black-
well Hospital, Inc, has announced 
that three applicants have been 
registered for tests for the Cisco 
Junior College Vocational Nurs-
ing Program. 

Taking physical tests on Wed-
nesday were Mrs. Ethel Sutton, 
Mrs. Jo Ann White, both of Gor-
man, and Mrs. Mary Jane Saine 
of Sipe Springs. Other applicants 
are expected before the deadline 
for registering March 14th. 

Anyone, age 18 through 55 
years, with good physical condi-
tion and mental health and has 
had at least a fifth grade educa-
tion, is eligible to apply. 

Persons interested in the nurs-
ing program may place their ap-
plications to Buel Bryan at the 
Blackwell Hospital, Inc. or to 
Mrs. Veneta Mitchell, Instructor 
at the Cisco Junior College on 
Mondays through Fridays or at 
her home in Cisco, HI 2-1449. 

Gerry Walker of Cisco and 
Mrs. J. E. Walker, Mrs, Don E. 
Rodgers and Mrs. T. F Morrow 
of Gorman attended the funeral 
of Mrs. Frank Daniels held in 
De Leon Saturday. 

Guests in the home of Mrs. 
Effie Broom Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. L. A. Bell and son, 
Chuck, and Derwin Key of Green 
ville, Denman Stanfield of Costa 
Rica, Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Por-
ter of Gorman and Mr and Mrs. 
Dwayne Clement of Temple. 

Mrs. J. C. Timmons and Mrs. 
Cullen Rodgers were in Ater and 
Gatesville last Wednesday and 
Thursday visiting with Mrs. Tim-
mon's sisters, Mrs. E. B. Hucka-
bee, Mrs. Tom Yows, and a niece, 
June Saunders, and Bobby Jack, 
Mrs. Ernest Timmons, and a sis-
ter-in-law, Mrs. Charles Baker. 
Mrs. Timmons visited Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs J. A. 
McNeely of the Kokomo com-
munity. 

Mr. and Mrs. Neal Gilbert, 
Steve and Lisa, visited their par-
ents, the Odis Rodgers and Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Gilbert, during 
last weekend. 

Visiting in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs L. B. Richards over the week 
end were her cousins, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Chalan of Sulphur 
Springs. 

Denman Stanfield, who is with 
the State Department in Costa 
Rica, visited this week with his 
sisters, Mrs. Effie Broom and Mr. 
and Mrs. Stanley Porter, and 
friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arland Alldredge 
and Sandy of Eastland visited 
Monday with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. George Hallmark. The 
Hallmarks visited in Brecken-
ridge on Saturday with a daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. George Bur-
rows. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Burfiend 
visited Sunday in Abilene with 
her brother, Iland Parter, who 
is a paient in Hendricks Memor-
ial Hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs Alvis Scitern and 
family spent the weekend in 
Hobbs and Eunice, N. M. with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. E. 
Daniels, and a sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. J. Goates. They were ac-
companied by Mr. and Mrs. Ger-
ald Scitern, Brenda and Anitta. 

Visitors in the home of Mrs. 
Gladys Lucke last weekend were 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. John-
ny Cooper, James and Jana of 
Karnes City. Another daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin Maxwell, 
Janet, Sharon and Regena of 

KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 

Mrs. W. N. Huddleston, Coman-
che County resident since 1906, 
was honored on her 93rd birth-
day Friday, March 4th, at the 
Ja-Joe Cafe in De Leon. 

Sharing the happy occasion 
with her were all six of her chil-
dren, their husbands and wives, 
and all the near-by grandchil-
dren and great-grandchildren. 

The long dining table was laid 
with a festive birthday cloth and 
centered with arrangement of 
fresh flowers. The honoree, wear-
ing a soft blue dress and black 
accessories, was graced with a 
corsage on either shoulder, one 
from family and one from friends. 
She sat at the head of the table. 

Fred Holdridge of De Leon, a 
grandson-in-law, gave the invo-
cation. 

Following a steak dinner the 
birthday cake was brought in 
bearing the numerals 93 in gold 
on the pink and white confection. 
Mrs. Lloyd Halbrooks, the young-
est daughter, served cake. 

The Huddleston family came to 
Texas from Johnson County, 
Arkansas in 1906 and settled in 
the Duster Community where the 
late W. N. Huddleston engaged 
in farming until his death on 
August 16, 1944. Mrs. Huddleston 
maintains a home in De Leon. 

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. H. J. Huddleston of De Leon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Huddleston of 
Comanche, Mr. and Mrs. T. L. 
(Bill) Huddleston of De Leon, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. A. Plumlee of De 
Leon, Mrs. W. A. Lay of Duster 
and De Leon, Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
V. Halbrooks of Bryan, Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Holdridge and son, Don 
of De Leon, Mr. and Mrs. Speedy 
Clark and children, Carol and 
Bill of Gorman, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Huddleston and children, 
Mike and Rhonda of De Leon. 

Young Joe Bob Huddleston not 
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rocery &Market 
BACON lb 79c PHONE 5316 —:— GORMAN 

Prices Good Through Saturday 

SHOP ONE STOP 

RED DART 	 303 CANS 

GREEN BEANS 2-29c 

2 

Veiveeta 
CHEESE 

lb box 8 9c 

SPEAS 
	

QUART BOTTLE 

APPLE JUICE 
	

4 -9 
HALF GALLON 

BUTTERMILK 
	39e 

Dutch - Apple or Choc. Drop LB. 

K  SUPREME COOKIES a P49:  

Chicken - Beef 

— $1 
MORTON'S FROZEN 

MEAT PIES 
FLELSCHMAN'S 	 ONE POUND 

SUNKIST 

ORANGES OLEO- Corn Oil 	39c POUND 

10c 
 

Decker's 
ALL MEAT 
One Pound .49 

ellOrine,siemzirs, 
BISCUITSK

H
be-'sa

id
or 5-.39 

CRACKER BARREL 	 LB. BOX 

CRACKERS 	25c Bologna KIMBELL'S 

CHILI 
NO. 2 CAN 

59c 
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