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NUMBER FIFTY-ONE 

William J. Robertson 
Joins Managerial Staff 
At Gorman Peanuts 

Mr. William J. Robertson of 
Suffolk, Virginia has become 
associated with the Gorman Pea-
nuts. He will be working in a 
managerial capacity with Mr. 
Tom Birdsong, who came to Gor-
man in 1965. 

Mr. Robertson has been with 
the Birdsong Storage Company 
at Suffolk. 

Noting the 37-year-old's ath-
letic build, the assumption that 
he might be interested in sports 
proves right. Baseball it is. "For 
seventeen years baseball and 
peanuts have worked together 
for me affording an interesting 
and enjoyable avocation with a 
likeable vocation, a good job," 
said Robertson. "The two being 
seasonal, I have been able to fol-
low the ball in the summer and 
shell the peanut in the fall." 

After these seventeen years he 
is leaving his coaching position 
with the Kansas City (Mo.) Ath-
letics in order that he may give 
all his time to the peanut in-
dustry. 

When asked just what the W. 
J. initials stood for Robertson 
said William and Joe, but I'm 
called "Robbie". 

At present he is making his 
home in Stephenville. His family, 
the wife and daughters, Robbye 
Jane, 11, and Jo Lynn, 17, will 
be heading down to Texas at the 
close of the school semester in 
June. They are members of the 
Baptist Church. 

Eastland Co. Farmers 
Union Animal Supper 
Set For Fekruary 15 

The Eastland County Farmers 
Union's Annual Supper will be 
held at 7 p. m. Tuesday, Febru-
ary 15 in the American Legion 
Hall in Rising Star. 

The menu will consist of chili, 
beans, home made pie and drinks. 
Adult tickets are 75c and children 
free. Tickets may be purchased 
from Claude Fuller, Wayne Eaves 
or D. B. Warren. 

Guest speaker for the evening 
will be the State President, Mr. 
Jay Naman of Waco. 

Everyone is invited to attend. 

Services For Gorman 
Relative Held Sunday 
In Stephenville 

Robert Leo Huckabee, 69, nep-
hew of Mrs. J. E. Foster, and 
former resident of Gorman, died 
at his home in Fort Worth Fri-
day, February 4th. 

Survivors include his wife; one 
daughter, Mrs. Louise Louder-
milk of Stephenville; one grand-
daughter, Mrs. Robert White of 
Fort Worth; and two sisters, Mrs. 
C. H. Smith of Abilene and Mrs. 
S. W. Peckham of Huntsville. 

Funeral services were held in 
Stephenville at 2 p. m. Sunday. 

The Woman's Study Club will 
sponsor a musical variety show 
on February 24. All proceeds 
from ticket sales will be used in 
constructing of the Community 
Swimming Pool. A highlight of 
the show will be a special guest 
appearance by the Cisco Junior 
College Band and Wrangler Bell-
es under the direction of Mr. 
Homer Kruger. Local residents 
who attended the Miss Gorman 

By KERNEL GENE, aPe e 
Drew W. Crain, member of the 

Coleman Volunteer Fire Dept., 
met with Gorman Volunteer Fire-
men Monday night to explain 
methods used in discouraging 
false fire alarms in Coleman. 

Evidently, people who turn in 
false alarms do not realize the 
severe penalty which could be 
imposed on them when caught. 
There are several methods for 
tracing offenders. Mr. Vardie 
Huff, Fire Chief, stated that he 
hoped to have one installed in 
Gorman in the near future. 

0 

Thanks to the City Commission 
and the Texas Electric Service 
Co. for the new street lights 
which are being installed in Gor-
man. Unless you have driven 
downtown after dark lately, 
you've missed a new look on 
Kent Street and Highway Six. 
Plans are to install lights in other 
sections of town also. 

• 
Pete Livingston and Bob 

Young, representatives of St...I--
Rite Corp., had an interested 
audience of 75 at Higginbotham's 
last Friday evening. Farmers and 
ranchers in this area have become 
irrigation conscious. Several have 
already found sufficient water on 
their land to make irrigation pro-
fitable. Others are beginning to 
follow suit. Surveys indicate 
there is an abundance of water 
in this area which will boost our 
economy if it is not wasted. 

Whether this has caused mer-
chants in Gorman to improve the 
appearance of their stores — or 
efforts of the Woman's Study 
Club has inspired them, I am not 
sure, BUT something has stirred 
them up. Henderson has com-
pletely renovated his variety 
store and is in the process of in-
stalling a completely new line of 
merchandise. 

0 

0  In conversation with several 
citizens lately, I have felt some-
what embarrassed - slightly cha-
grined, but after giving it due 
thought, somewhat amused and 
appreciative, too. For some un-
known reason these thoughtful 
people are accusing me of trying 
to do too much for MY commun-
ity and nearby towns. 

Actually, I do very little in 
comparison to others. However, 
in my position, what I do is 
probably more noticeable. For in-
stance, Joe and Estelle gave me 
quite a headline last week as be-
ing chairman of the March of 
Dimes. Estelle saw that the jars 
were placed in stores - the school 
handled their collection - mer-
chants are being called by tele-
phone and have agreed to send 
their checks to the Progress of-
fice. Some checks have already 
come in. Others will follow suit, 
I hope. The Woman's Study Club 
is handling the "Mother's March". 

Nov, as to the things I do for 
the clubs, churches and young-
sters, in the way of printing; I 
have the facilities and enjoy help-
ing out. Actually, I am not out 
very much cash and don't put in 
near as much time as most of 
those who do civic work. 

As to the churches - I have an 
unwritten agreement with all 
preachers and ministers that 
when I help their particular 
church they are supposed to put 
a star in my crown (?) — I had 
one crown filled and was work-
ing on a spare when I took a 

HULLS 

KING SIZE TURNIP — Mr. 0. T. Shell wasn't even trying 
to produce king size vegetables when he grew the seven and 
one fourth pound turnip on his farm west of Gorman. The 
beautifully-colored purple top turnip, a perfect vegetable 
speciman, measured 27 inches in length and eight inches in 
circumference. The seeds were purchased from W. G. (Mule 
Barn) Baker Feed & Seed Store, and Mr. Shell complained 
to Mr. Baker about the quality of the seed and said "no tell-
ing what size the turnip might have grown if he had had 
good seed." 

1 9 	16  6  
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WEST TEM PRESS ISSOORTIO ormatt Progrms 
OUR 65TH YEAR OF SERVICE — 5c Per Copy 

BENEFIT VARIETY SHOW SLATED' 
FEBRUARY 28 FOR POOL FUND Gorman Cagers To Play At 

Moran On Friday Night At 7 Coronation last October will re-
member the Cisco Jr. College 
Combo group, female vocalist, 
Wrangler Belles and piano player 
all of whom provided very fine 
entertainment. On February 24th 
the program will include all of 
these plus additional musical 
numbers. Also on hand to provide 
entertainment will be popular 
local talent groups. 

Tickets will be 50 cents for 
everyone and will go on sale 
within a few days. The Variety 
Show will begin at 7:30 p. m. in 
the High School Auditorium. 

ADDITIONAL 
CONTRIBUTIONS 
BUILD POOL FUND 

Several local businesses have 
made contributions the past few 
days to the Community Swim-
ming Pool Fund. These are list-
ed below, together with other 
donations made since the last 
such listing in the Progress: 

The Gorman Pantherettes won I 
over the Putnam girls last Friday , 
night on the local court by a'  
score of 49 to 33 to remain in a 
tie with the Carbon girls in 14-B 
District race. Bennie Peveto led 
the Gorman scoring with 25 
points and Laverne Scitern got 
19. Petty scored 27 points for Put-
nam. 

In the boys game Friday night 
the Putnam team won handily 
over Gorman by a score of 70 to 
30. Isenhower led the Putnam 
scoring with 23 points. Daryl 
Hirst hit 9 to lead the Gorman 
scoring and Mike Rodgers got 8. 

In action on Tuesday night on 
the local court the Panthers 
edged the Olden Hornets by a 
score of 47 to 45. Mike Rodgers 
scored 21 points for Gorman and 
Bob Miller had 19 for Olden. 

Chaille Gray, 73, died Satur-
day, January 29th, at his home 
near Magdalena, N. M. He was 
a former resident of Comanche, 
having moved to New Mexico ten 
years ago. 

Mr. Gray was born June 6, 1892 
in Gorman, the son of Dr. and 
Mrs. Andrew J. Gray of Coman-
che. He was married June 16, 
1917 to Miss Neely Mankin. He 
was a member of the Church of 
Christ. 

Funeral services were held at 
10 a. m. Wednesday, February 2 
in the Comanche Funeral Home 
Chapel with Clarence Bryant and 
Dennis Kellog officiating. Inter-
ment was in Oakwood Cemetery. 

Mr. George Hollifield of Gor-
man, a cousin, attended the fun-
eral. Mrs. Henry Capers and Mrs. 
Huron Palnoc of Gorman are also 
cousins of Mr. Gray. 

ITEMS OF 
INTEREST 

A Donkey Basketball Game is 
slated for Tuesday, February 15 
at 7:30 p. m. in the school gym. 
The game is sponsored by the 
Senior Class. Admission 75c & $1. 

The dates for distribution of 
USDA Surplus Foods for East-
land County for the month of 
February are as follows: 

Monday, February 14 - East-
land, Olden and Ranger. 

Tuesday, February 15 - Pioneer 
Rising Star, Okra, Carbon, Gor-
man and Desdemona. 

Wednesday, February 16 - Cis-
co, Scranton and Nimrod. 

The Social Security Represent-
ative will be in Gorman Monday, 
February 14 at 10 a. m. at the 
City Office. 

The Drivers License Represent-
ative will be in Gorman Thurs-
day, February 17 at 10 a. m. at 
the City Office. 

The Board of Trustees of the 
Gorman Independent School Dis-
trict will meet Monday night, 
February 14 at 7:30 p. m. 

The Business Men's Club will 
meet Monday night, February 14 
at 6:30 p. m. at the Brown Jug. 

The Gorman 4-H Club will 
meet Monday, February 14 at the 
Fire Hall. 

The City Council will meet on 
Thursday, February 17 at the 
City Office at 4 p. m. 

LVNA Division No. 64 will 
meet February 14 at 7:30 p. m. 
in the Home Ec Building in Gor-
man. Guest speaker will be Dr. 
L. C. Park. The Board of Direc-
tors will meet at 7 p. m. 42 and 
other games will be played. All 
members are urged to attend. 

Jerry Naylor, TV and Record-
ing Star, will head the list of tal-
ent at the Stage Show to be held 
in De Leon on February 17th in 
the High School Auditorium. It 
is sponsored by the Senior Class 
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Preston's Florist 
Gorman Progress 
Wright Implement Co. 
Texas Electric Serv. Co. 
Higginbotham Bros. 
Mehaf fey Drug 
Smith Bros. 
Jay's Grocery 
Carl Dean Stacy 
James H. Brown 
E. G. Henderson 
Ray Rankin 
D. B. Warren 
Nathan Files 
V. 0. Huff 
E. L. Dennis 
W. D. Preston 

Burke Musgrove Seeks 
Election As State 
Rep. Of 63rd. District 

Burke Musgrove of Brecken-
ridge today announce dhis candi-
dacy for State Representative, 
63rd District, in the Democratic 
primary election — the seat va-
cated by Wayne Gibbens, now 
on Governor Connally's Staff in 
Washington. 

Musgrove has completed six 
years at The University of Texas, 
majoring in chemical engineering 
and business. He was selected in 
1963 as "Outstanding Student" 
from the 24,000 member student 
body, among numerous other 
honors. 

Having lived in Breckenridge 
for more than 20 years, Musgrove 
has been considered an outstand-
ing young member of the com-
munity. He was awarded the 
State and National Elks Founda-
tion "Most Valuable High School 
Student" Scholarship. Brecken-
ridge High, School classmates 
elected him "Best All Round 
Roy." 

Later at the University of 
Texas, Musgrove, as president of 
numerous organizations, played 
an active role in student im-
provements, including library, 
language lab and student hous-
ing expansion. In recognition of 
this leadership he was awarded 
the Sons of the American Revo-
lution Medal of Honor, the Chi-
cage Tribune Award and the 
Berry Whitaker Leadership A-
ward. He was on the Board of 
Directors of The University Co-
Op, a store serving the Univer-
sity community and doing an 
annual 4 million dollar business. 

Musgrove, 25, is the son of Mrs. 
Dale Musgrove and the brother 
of Mrs. Phil Pitzer of Brecken-
ridge. On the death of his father, 
Glenn Musgrove, when Burke 
was 11, he began the work that 
carried him through his high 
school and college years. 

Employed by the Graridge Cor-
poration in Breckenridge, he be-
came familiar with the different 
aspects and problems concerning 
the oil industry while working 
after class in high school and 
during several summers in col-
lege. While attending The Uni-
versity, Musgrove represented 
several local and area independ-
ent oil operators by securing rec-
ords and information from the 
Texas Railroad Commission in 
Austin. 

Widely known in youth devel-
opment work, Musgrove was the 
program co-ordinator of the first 
statewide Attorney General's 
Youth Conference in which over 
1200 high school leaders partici-
pated. The Conference, now an-
nual, has been a key factor in 
curtailing the state's rising ju-
venile crime rate. 

Musgrove has worked with 
numerous state officials as the 
co-ordinator for eight years for 
the American Legion Boys State 
program, held each year in the 
State Capitol Building in Austin. 

The entire picture on the pool 
reflecting the total funds theo-
retically available now is shown 
below. The term "theoretical" is 
necessary because it is not at this 
writing definitely known whether 
all 1966 pledges can be met this 
week. 

Words was received early Wed-
nesday morning by Mrs. Oda 
Monroe of the critical illness of 
Floyd Rider. He is in the Mc-
Cleskey Veterans Hospital in 
Temple. 

This program has afforded thous-
ands of young Texans — and 
young Americans — with the in-
spiration to become active, par-
ticipating citizens.- In recognition 
for his outstanding service to 
youth, the Breckenridge Lions 
Club awarded Musgrove honor-
ary membership. 

"I desire to be of service to 
this area," Musgrove said in an-
nouncing his candidacy, "in order 
that I might repay some of the 
blessings and opportunities that 
have been provided me. It is cer-
tainly an honor and a compliment 
to be encouraged by many friends 
to offer my service in the capac-
ity of State Representative. How-
ever, to be successful I will be 
calling on more and more of my 
friends, acquaintances, and lots 
of people I have not yet met to 
assist with my campaign. This 
promises to be a long and costly 
campaign — one which I cannot 
win without broad-based support 
from the many of you interested 
in good government and effect-
ive, energetic representation," 
Musgrove concluded. 

FUNERAL SER!flGES 
FOR CHAILLE GRAY 

HELD FEBRUARY 2 

DOUBLE SERVICES 
ON SATURDAY FOR 
THE DAVE STANLEYS 

Double services for Mr. Dave 
Stanley, 79, and his wife, Mrs. 

rIda Stanley, 84, were held at 2:30 
p. m. Saturday in the Arrington 
Hamner Funeral Chapel in East-
land with Rev. Lester Davenport, 
pastor of the First Methodist 
Church of Eastland, officiating. 

Married in December of 1916, 
both Mr. and Mrs. Stanley had 
been residents of the Flatwood 
Community for the past 50 years. 

Mrs. Stanley, born March 11, 
1881, in Comanche County, pass-
ed away Thursday, February 3 
in Eastland Memorial Hospital. 
She was a member of the Meth-
odist Church. 

Survivors include four sisters, 
Mrs. Lela Leach of Gorman, Mrs. 
Viola Noel of De Leon, Mrs. 011ie 
Giddeon of Sweetwater and Mrs. 
Alice Norris of Oklahoma. 

Mr. Stanley, who passed away 
February 4 in Eastland Memorial 
Hospital, was born October 14, 
1885. He was a retired farmer 
and also a member of the First 
Methodist Church. 

Survivors are three sisters, 
Mrs. Ela Bowman of Artesia, N. 
M., Mrs. Jimmy R. Stone of Ari-
zona and Mrs. 011ie Dollberry of 
Route 1, Eastland. 

Present Bank Balance $4,339.78 
Amount committed but 

not collected 	1,775.00 
Total Bank Balance 

& Committed 	$6,114.78 
First Year Pledges 

(Not Paid) 	$1,330.00 

$7,444.78 

Grand Total Available 
(Provided Committments 
& Pledges are 
paid in full 

In the girls game the Panther-
ettes lost a had fought game to 
Stephenville by a score of 39-33. 
Laverne Scitern won honors for 
Gorman with 21 points. 

The Gorman Cagers will travel 
to Moran on Friday night in their 
final regular schedule game. The 
Pantherettes will need a win over 
the Moran girls to remain in a 
tye for the 14-B District race 
with Carbon. A win for the Pan- 
therettes would necessitate a 
play-off game with Carbon to 
determine who would represent 
the district in the bi-district play-
offs. 

The Panthers will be seeking 
their third district win. 

FINAL RITES FOR 
L. C. SUTTON, 14, 
HELD ON SATURDAY 

Mr. L. C. Sutton, 74, retired 
railroad switchman and former 
resident of Gorman, died Thurs-
day, February 3 in Fireside Nurs-
ing Home in Marietta, Oklahoma 
from an illness of three years. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p. m. Saturday, February 5 in 
Higginbotham Funeral Chapel in 
Gorman with Audy Moore, min-
ister of the Church of Christ, 
officiating. Burial was in Murray 
Memorial Cemetery of Carbon 
under the direction of Higgin-
botham Funeral Home. 

Born April 17, 1891 in Coman-
che County, he was a member of 
the Church of Christ and Elk's 
Lodge in Marietta, Okla., where 
he had made his home since 1958. 

Survivors are two daughters, 
Mrs. Velma Tomi of Flint, Mich- 
igan and Mrs. Blanche Anderson 
of Garland; three sons, Chester 
L. Sutton of Lubbock, Charles 
and Billy Ray Sutton of San 
Francisco, Calif.; two brothers, 
Cecil Sutton of Carbon and J. W. 
Sutton of Eastland; 13 grandchil- 
dren and 14 great-grandchildren.. 

Pallbearers were Jack Abbott, 
H. M. Gilbert, George Putman, 
Glenn Justice, C. C. Gilbert and 
Pete Underwood. 

MR. & MRS. JOE MAUNEY 
HAVE NEW SON 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Mauney of 
Tampa, Florida happily announce 
the arrival of their adopted son, 
Doyle Wade, born December 21, 
1965, who came to live with them 
January 28, 1966. He weighed 7 
pounds. 

A daughter, Paula, age 8, is 
also proud of her baby brother. 

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Mauney of Gorman. 

CARD OF THANKS 
This is to express my thanks 

to the doctors, nurses and entire 
hospital staff and the many fri-
ends for the cards, gifts, visits 
and flowers, and every kind deed 
during my recent stay in Black-
well Hospital. 

May God bless each of you. 
Mrs. Bill Slaton 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to take this 

means of expressing our thanks 
and appreciation to everyone for 
their kindness extended us in the 
loss of our loved one, Dick Ma-
son. You were so kind to send 
flowers, cards and food. A special 
thanks to Mr. 0. R. Buchanan 
and Higginbotham Funeral Home 
staff. 

The Family' of 
Dick Mason 
and his sisters 

NEW GRANDSON FOR 
THE CHARLIE GARRETTS 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Mac Nichols 
of Houston announce the arrival 
of their son, Jeffery Curtis, born 
January 28. He weighed 9 pounds. 

The Nichols have two other 
children, Kelly, age 5, and Kim, 
age 2. 

Maternal grandparents are Mr_ 
and Mrs. Charlie Garrett of Gor-
man and paternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Bill Nichols of 
Ranger. 

Great-grandparents are Mrs.. 
Wade and Mrs. Nichols of Ran-
ger. 

CARD OF THANKS 

All businesses, organizations 
and individuals who wish to 
contribute toward the swim-
ming pool and have not yet 
done so are asked to leave their 
donations at the city office, 
deposit them at the First Na-
tional Bank to the Community 
Swimming Pool Fund or turn 
in their donations to a mem-
ber of the Swimming Pool 
Committee. 

CARD OF THANKS 

I , wish to thank my friends, the 
hospital staff and doctors for the 
cards, gifts and acts of kindness 
during my recent stay in the hos-
pital. 

Mrs. Geneva Bailey 

stand that caused me to lose most 
of my stars. Nov I have to work 
a little harder to have them re-
placed. 

FINALLY — I have been an 
active worker off and on in 
churches of several denomina-
tions most of my life. However, it 
was only after I moved to Gor-
man that I became fully aware 
of the blessings I had received 
from the good Lord. How little 
I had done for Him. How little 
we, regardless of our church 
affiliation, do toward practicing 
what we teach and are taught. 
So, I decided to accept each day 
with thanks and do my best to 
serve my fellowmen in a way 
that might be in keeping with 
what mother and sister had in-
stilled in me in my younger rays. 

It is truly said, "when one cast 
stale bread upon the water it 
will come back covered with Pea-
nut Butter." Mine has and I have 
no worries, no bothers and no 
ulcers .So please quit fussing at 
me because I enjoy doing for 
others. 

We want to express our grati-
tude and appreciation to friends 
and neighbors who extended 
sympathy during the hours of our 
recent sorrow, also for the flow-
ers, cards and food, and all other 
acts of kindness. 

The sisters, nieces 
and nephews of 

Mr. & Mrs. Dave Stanley 
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FABULOUS SHOE SALE 
400 PAIRS OF SHOES 

SCOOP UP SAVINGS! 

Poll Parrot & Scamperoos 
For Children 

FORMER SALE PRICE $2.98 

NOW 2 PAIR FOR $5.00 
PLUS - DOUBLE S&H GREEN STAMPS 

HALLMARK 
VALENTINE CARDS 

For your Valentine choose from our vast selection 

of Old-Fashioned, Contemporary and Modem Designs. 

I U 	.00 Priced from I ac to $1  

W. H. SMITH 
DEPARTMENT STORE 

WE GIVE S&H GREEN STAMPS 
DE LEON, TEXAS 	 PHONE 2135 

	4111111MNIMIWil 

DINETTE SETS 
ONE-FOURTH OFF 	LANE CEDAR CHESTS Payroll is the great inter- 

est in our area 
$362,229.00 in dividends was paid to our savers in 
1965. (This is quite a payroll) The bulk of our total 
assets is invested in, and working for, this area. 
This is additional 

PAYROLL, EMPLOYMENT 
and general economic gain or everyone. 

Our current anticipated dividend is 

4ffo 
• Each account insured to $10,000.00 by branch of 

Federal Government. 

• Funds received by 10th of month earn 
from 1st. 

• Any account withdrawable immediately. 

STORE RE 4-5319 - LUMBER YARD RE 4-5419 

FUNERAL HOME - AMBULANCE 	Day or Night — Phone RE 4-2272 

COLLINS & SONS 
AGENCY 

Mrs. Rooney Williams, Agent 

Phone RE 4-5411 	Gorman 

?may's 
Carth666 
DR. W. H. STEPHEN 

Optometrist 
Thursday's in De Leon 

Phone 4475 
GL 5-2444 	Dublin, Texas 

Ruby Springer 
Income Tax Service 

Bookkeeping and 

Insurance 

RANGER, TEXAS 

New Location — 106 N. Austin 
Paramount Hotel Building 

Office Hours 
Monday-Friday 	.. 9 to 5 
Saturday  	8 to 12 

Except by Appointment 

Off. Phone MI 7-3230 
Res. MI 7-3237 

HIGH SCHOOL HONOR ROLL 
FOR THIRD SIX WEEKS 

WANT ADS  
First class renovating on mattresses 
We make new cotton, innerspring, 
and Box Spring mattresses. BARBER 
Mateo Factory. Ph. 5841, De Leon. 
Tree Pick-up and delivery. 	fa 

LOST: Red, Bald face steer calf 
with OT brand on left side. Call 
collect, 0. T. Shell, RE 4-5659. 
Gorman 	 1-2-10c 

FOR SALE 5-room house located 
next door to Delma Beauty Shop. 
Priced for quick sale $1800. J. C. 
Grice, RE 4-5476. 	2-10 Inc 

KOKOMO NEWS 
We regret having failed to pub-

lish the high school six weeks 
honor roll last week. 

By MRS. GLENN JORDAN 

I am getting good reports from 
my dad, Jim Lewallen, and bro-
ther, Jamie Lewallen, who were 
injured in an automobile acci-
dent. Daddy was dismissed from 
the hospital in Plainview on Sat-
urday and returned to his home 
in Muleshoe to recuperate. Jamie 
is improving daily, but will re-
main in the hospital in Plainview 
for some time yet. They send 
their thanks for all the prayers 
and cards from their friends at 
Kokomo and Gorman. 

A Sweetheart Banquet for the 
youth of Kokomo Baptist Church 
and their guests is being planned 
for February 19 beginning at 7 
p. M. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Fuller, 
Christi and Rickey, Mr. and Mrs. 
Odis Rodgers, Bob and Mike, and 

DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE 
As near as your nearest Telephone 

Telephone DTT 6-3303 
Hamilton, Texas 

307 acres, 220 cult., 9a peanut al-
lotment, good land, one of best, 
$145 acre. 82 acres, Carbon, 50 
peanut allotment, 72 cultivation, 
good land, fair house, $155 acre. 
163 acres, 60 acres nice coastal, 
6 tanks, excellent fences, real 
stock place, $125 acre. 244 acres, 
76 cultivation, $925. year soil 
bank payments, lots bottom type 
land, real fencs, strong grass, $125 
acre. See us for the best. Delton 
Cogburn Real Estate, Hwy. 6, De 
Leon. 	 1-6fnc 

A HONOR ROLL 
Mack Sutton, Joyce Joiner, 

Glenda Jordan, Anita Acrea, 
Dwayne Snider, Elizabeth Parr, 
Mary Kirk, Doyle Shipman and 
Randy Ormbsy. 

A-B HONOR ROLL 
Marilyn Shell, Carole Rankin, 

Laverne Scitern, Daryl Hirst, 
Connie Park, John Gilbert, Barry 
Redman, Jerry Mathews, Teddy 
Higginbottom, Burl Harper, and 
Jimmie Belyeu. 

Gorman, who spent several days 
in the hospital at Gorman, was 
able to go to the home of her 
daughter, Mrs. Aline Lockhart in 
Breckenridge, on Monday to re-
cuperate. 

Mrs. J. L. Morrow was in the 
hospital at Eastland for several 
days with the flu and an allergy 
to some of the medicine she was 
given. She was able to return 
home on Monday and reports that 
she feels fine. 

Mrs. Morrow's sister, Alma Lee 
Creager of Levelland, underwent 
surgery last week in Levelland 
and is reported to be doing fine 
now. 

PRECISION SAW FILING 
Saws re-toothed. Hand, Circle, band 
saws and power blades. Every tooth 
made uniform, Tic-curate, and needle 
sharp on our Folty Automatic Saw 
Filer. Mail or bring your saws to L. 

E. Capers. Box 402, Gorman, Tex. 76454. 
Repair service on all types of guns, 
electric appliances. 	 fn. 

NEED 
An Extra Key - Made While You 
Wait! Rankin Army-Navy Sur- 
plus. 	 11-29fne 

FOR SALE — The home of Ben 
Pendarvis on West Roberts St. 
Contact B. F. Pendarvis, 108 
Realto Circle, San Antonio, Texas 
78232. 	 4-2-17c 

WATER SOFTENERS 
1Farifieation - Filtration - Removal el 
Iron, stele, taste, o4or & sediment. 
Free Water Analysis. Call Hasse, 879-
21Tt Wilson Water Condition Sevice, 
Comanche, Texas 	 8-13fric 

REAL ESTATE — Ranches and 
Farms - All sizes to buy or sell. 
Contact Ranch & Farm Service, 
Eastland, Phone MA 9-2131. Buck 
Wheat. 	 4-3fnc 

WANTED — Listings on farms, 
ranches. real estate of all kinds. 
Listings appreciated. Delton Cog-
burn, Agent, Hwy. 6, De Leon, 
Texas. Phone 7842. 	9-30fnc 

Don Everton, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elver Everton, has received 
his discharge from the Navy after 
several years of service. He is 
presently enrolled in Ranger Jr 
College and also has employment 
with the Victor Cornelius firm 
in Eastland. 

Mrs. D. F. Eaves and Deliah, 
Mrs. F. C. Eaves of Gorman and 
Mrs. Spurlen of Eastland spent 
Tuesday in Weatherford visiting 
with the Neal Eaves family who 
moved to Weatherford recently 
from Comanche. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bo Caraway have 
moved to Waco where he is em-
ployed with the Soil Conservation 
Service. We wish Bo and Pat the 
very best in their new home. 

Little Brenda Scitern, 16 mo. 
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ger-
ald Scitern, was dismissed from 
the Eastland hospital on Monday 
after having been there several 
days with a virus. 

TYPEWRITER REPAIR — For 
All Your Typewriter, Adding Ma-
chine repairs and cleaning, or a 
new typewriter, contact Estelle 
Craddock at the Gorman Progress 
office, RE 4-5410. 

If you are serious about selling 
your Real Estate, see or call Le-
land Nabors, Realtor, Bus. Phone 
2371, Res. 4872, De Leon. 11-4fnc 

REAL ESTATE — If you are 
looking for the best in Real Estate, 
See Don Rodgers. 	10-21fnc 

See us for your Irrigation Needs. 
Complete line of pumps, pipe and 
equipment. Drilling and testing. 
Ardean Kimmell Irrigation Ser-
vice, Hwy. 6, De Leon, Phone 7191, 
Res. 3922. 	 11-25fnc 

nf=ititi.tnt=ittIrtatIrS=1=1.MMT=11  

Dr. Fehrman He 
Lund, Optometrist 
MA 9-1177 - 405-6 Exchange Bldg 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 
313 Main Si. - RANGER, TEXAf 
In Ranger - 1 to 5:30 Tuesday: 

8:30 to 12:00 Fridays 
Closed Thurs. & Sal. Afternoon 
Tmtffitreztnen=te 

CISCO LOCKER PLANT 
We Sell Beef by 1/4 1/2  or Whole 
All Kinds of Freezer Supplies 

Processing Guaranteed 
Amana Freezers For Sale, All Sizes 

109 W. 9th St. - Cisco - HI 2-1377 
STAR REFRIGERATION CO. 

Commercial Refrigeration, Air 
Conditioning and Heating sales and 
service. 20 years experience. See 
Roy Legg at Higginbothams. Call 
RE 4-5319, Gorman. 	11-1 line 

If you want a peanut farm, pecan 
bottom, a Texas Size Ranch, or 
a nice home, see or call Leland 
Nabors, Realtor, Phone 2371 or 
4872, De Leon. 	11-4-Inc 

FOR SALE — Approximately 10 
acres, all or half with minimum 
down payment. Mrs. Bula Ste-
phens, 2121 Ridgeway St., Arling- 
ton, Texas. 	 7-1-27c 

FOR SALE — 1956 4-door Bel 
Air Chevrolet. Allis-Chalmers 
feed grinder. J. W. (Dub) Brown, 
Gorman. 	 1-27-fnc 

1311111111111111a 	 

GIFTS THAT SAY 

THE REAL McCOYS 
By ROONEY WILLIAMS 

• 

FOR SALE or LEASE — 180 
acre farm, 80 acres grass, 80 acres 
cultivation. Located in Jewell 
Community. Joe Barnett, Gor- 
man, Texas. 	 1-27fnc 

FOR SALE — One GMC 671 Die-
sel Motor, root blower, complete 
with clutch and power take-off. 
Mounted on four wheel trailer. 
Trailer jacks under each wheel. 
Good condition. $2,600 or con-
sider trade. See Ed Craig at Ham-
ilton Mill & Elevator, Hamilton, 
Texas, Ph. Dudley 6-5917 4-2-24c 

FOR SALE - 85 acre farm with 
house on Eastland Hwy. No pea-
nut allotment. Priced for quick 
sale. W. H. Varner Agency, Des-
demona, Phone 2413. 2-17p (k) 

FOR SALE - 1959 Chevrolet V8 
Bel Air 4-dr, Sedan with automa-
tic transmission, radio, heater, 
white side wall tires. One owner. 
Excellent cond. Write or call Neal 
Gilbert, OR 2-6610 Abilene, Tex! 

2-2-17p 

HELP WANTED — Nurses Aid. 
Apply at Lawndale Home For 
Senior Citizens. RE 4-5720, Gor- 
man. 	 12-23fnc 

"INCOME TAX SERVICE" —
See Speedy Clark at Gorman 
Progress office. Day or night ap-
pointment. Call RE 4-5410. 1-6fn 

February Bargain rates on The 
Abilene Reporter-News. Morning 
and Sunday, 7 days a week for 
one year - $19.95. Morning only -
one year 812.50. To subscribe call 
Estelle Craddock RE 4-5410. 

011mIOWS 	 

MATTRESSES 
In Gorman - Call RE 4-5611 

• New and Renovate 
• Choice of Firmness 
• Choice of Ticking 
• New Innerspring Unit 
• Cleaned, Felted Cotton 
• New Mattress Guarantee 

Western Mattress Co. 
Box 5288 - San Angelo 

Entered as Second Clam Mall at the 

Post Office In Gorman, Texas under 

the Act of March 3. 1878. Published 

on Thursday at Gorman, Eastland 

County. Texas 76454. 

KERNEL GENE BAKER, Owner-Pub. 

JOE BENNETT, Assistant Publisher 

MRS. ESTELLE CRADDOCK, Editor 

ADVERTISING RATES: 
Display, per column inch — 56c 
Classified Advertising - 3c word 

Minimum Charge - 60c 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Eastland. Comanche Counties 

$2.00 per year 

All other subscriptions, $4.00 per year 

Service Men, Complimentary 

	'a I 

Ben B. 
McCollum Jr., DVIVI 

VETERINARY CLINIC 
STEPHENVILLE 

on Ft Worth Hwy. 
Service Day and Night 

WO 5-5217 - Res. WO 5-5218 

At (cannot firagrtt 

Kathy Browning, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Hirst, Daryl and Patty, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Jordan, Glen-
da and Teddy, were dinner guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Preston 
and Martha at their home in 
Gorman on Sunday, Feb. 6. The 
occasion being an appreciation 
dinner for Mrs. Fuller for the 
time she has spent helping the 
"Continentals" quartet. The Con-
tinentals, Martha, Glenda, Mike 
and Daryl, with Mrs. Fuller as 
pianist, were also celebrating 
their first anniversary. They sang 
together for the first time on the 
first Sunday in February, 1965. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Cole of Ker-
mit have been visiting with his 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. John Lasater. 

Mr. and Mrs. Neal Gilbert, Lisa 
and Steve of Abilene, spent Fri-
day night with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Odis Rodgers. Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Rodgers and Kim 
of Carbon also visited with the 
Rodgers family on Friday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vern Garrett 
spent the weekend in Abilene 
with their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Hallmark, Becky and Deb-
bie. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buchanan of 
Sweetwater visited with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hen-
dricks, over the weekend. Other 
visitors in the Hendricks home 
on Sunday were Mrs. Don Brum-
below and Mr. and Mrs. Buel 
Bryan of Gorman, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilbourne Wood, Terri and Craig 
of Carbon. Mr. and Mrs. Ed Har-
rison were visiting with the Hen-
drickses on Monday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Elwin At-
chison and family of Fort Worth 
visited with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Calvin Brown, on Sunday. 
Don Elwin Atchison attended the 
services at the Kokomo Baptist 
Church on Sunday morning. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buchanan of 
Sweetwater were visitors at Ko-
komo Baptist Church Sunday. 

Rev. and Mrs. J. W. O'Neal and 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne White visit-
ed with Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Spee-
gle in Baird on Saturday. Mr. 
Speegle is in the hospital in Baird 
having suffered a heart attack. 
The Speegles live in Putnam. 
They are former residents of this 
community. 

Mrs. Pete Snider reports that 
her aunt, Mrs. Lavada Ward of 

The best loved Cupids 
choose their heart-ill- 

ery from our glorious 
collection of g if t s to 
please every Valentine 

TAAKU-ke 
WE WANTS TA 61T A GROUP 
INSURANCE POLICY WITH 

GUNS BAGS 
& AMMUNITION STEREOS CLOCK RADIOS 

CARPETING 
& FLOOR COVERING BEDROOM SUITES RECLINERS 

Will You HELP THE AREA ECON- 

OMY AS WELL AS YOURSELF and 

— open or add to a savings account 

— inquire about your home load need 

at esti.  

ELECTRIC 
SKILLETS MAPLE ROCKERS 

TRANSISTOR 	ELECTRIC 
RADIOS 	CAN OPENERS 

STEPHENVILLE SAVINGS 
AND WAN ASSOCIATION 

k 	 PHONE WO 5-3166 
11 TT 

Stephenville, Texas 
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WEEPING OAK 
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 
Dial 4281 	De Leon 

SHOWING THROUGH FRIDAY 

CONNIE FRANCIS - HARVE PRESNELL In 

"WHEN THE BOYS MEET THE GIRLS" 
In Metrocolor 

SATURDAY ONLY 

DEAN MARTIN & JERRY LEWIS In 

"PARDNERS" 
In Color 

—PLUS— 

RICHARD HARRISON & LOREDANA NUSCIAK In 

"SEVENGLADIATORS" 
In Color 

* * * 

SUNDAY - MONDAY & 'TUESDAY 

VINCENT PRICE - FRANKIE AVALON 
DWAYNE HICKMAN & SUSAN HART In 

"DR. GOLDFOOT & 
THE BIKINI MACHINE" 

Cinemascope & Color 
	1 

CONTINENTAL 
WATER WELL DRILLING 
Complete Irrigation Systems 

and Service 
TURN KEY JOBS 

ROTARY DRILLING - AIR TESTING 

Reda Submergible Pumps - Alcoa Aluminum Pipe 

Sales and Service 	Completely Installed 

Jacuzzi - Red Jacket Pumps 

Member of Lone Star Water Well Association 

WILLIAM E. MESSER 	HOMER D. SANDERS 
DRILLER 	 MANAGER 

PHONE RE 4-5575 	 GORMAN, TEXAS 
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Chevrolet Impala Sport Sedan with Body Tiy Fisher 

Soft contoured new Strato-bucket 
front seats come standard in 
Super Sports for relaxing comfort 
on every trip. 
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Sunday visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. James Miears were 
her mother, Mrs. Bertha Mehaf-
fey of Cisco, and her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. David Goodwin and 
family of Tolar. 

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Cole of 
Kermit were weekend visitors in 
the home of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. C. Cole. 

Visiting in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs Avery Yarbrough for the 
past two weeks were their chil-
dren, A/lc and Mrs. Neal Gurlin, 
Kathy and Neal Phillip of Ger-
many, now stationed in Lubbock, 
and Mrs. Billy Jo Smith, Billy 
and Deborah of Irving, 

Mrs. Rosa Boucher and Mrs. D. 
J. Jobe visited last week in Crys-
tal City with Mr. and Mrs. Art 
Cribbs. 

Miss Don Moorman of Fort 
Worth was a weekend visitor 
with her mother, Mrs. Dona 
Moorman. 

Mrs. Ray Legg and Dorothy 
and Mollie Steele spent the week 
end in Houston with friends and 
Mrs. C. H. Baker, mother of Mrs. 
Legg. 

Mrs. E. C. Schow of Clifton 
spent Friday with her sister, Mrs. 
Etha Pittman. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Files of Abi-
lene were Gorman visitors Sat-
urday. 

Mrs. E. W. Underwood of Fort 
Worth spent the weekend with 
her mother, Mrs. T. F. Morrow. 

Miss Gerry Walker of Cisco 
was a weekend visitor in the 
home of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. E. Walker. 

Mr and Mrs. Terry Clark of 
Arlington were weekend visitors 
with their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
D. R. Clark and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Rodgers. 

Weekend guest in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Simmons and 
Mrs. W. J. Duke was Mrs. Mary 
Hogan of Fort Worth. 

Carol Ramesy and roommates, 
Kathy Duncan, Sarah Jo Adams 
and Janelle Philen of Fort Worth, 
spent the weekend with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Ramsey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Wheeler of 
Denton were weekend visitors 
with their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Blair and Mrs. John 
Wheeler. 

KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 
Mr. and Mrs. Don E. Rodgers 

and Mrs. T. F. Morrow visited in 
Eastland Saturday with their 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Haley. 

Mrs. Gladys Lucke was in An-
son Friday to attend the funeral 
of a sister-in-law, Mrs. Eaton 
Womack. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Knight of 
Dallas were guests Monday in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Gene Bak-
er. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. S. Fairbetter 
of Boyd are visiting this week 
with his brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
M. H. Fairbetter and Milton Jr. 

E. G. Henderson was in Dallas 
attending market for the variety 
store this week. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. J. 
R. Todd during the weekend were 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Todd and 
Dickie and Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Todd of Slaton and Mr. and Mrs. 
Delmer Shugart and family of 
Granbury. 

Mrs. Berta Poynor, Mrs. Rob 
Kinser and Mr. and Mrs. Bert 
Frazier of De Leon were in Elgin 
Sunday to attend the funeral of 
their uncle, Henry J. Ward 

Burleson, and Mr. and Mrs. R. 
G. Lewis, Vicki and Philip. Also 
visiting the Burlesons were Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Jack Burleson and 
family. 

Little Debra Guthery is in the 
hospital with pneumonia. She is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Buck Guthery. 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
This newspaper has been auth-

orized to announce the following 
candidates for public office sub-
ject to action of the Democratic 
Primary Election on May 7, 1966: 

For County Commissioner, Pct. 2: 
GLENN JUSTICE (re-election) 
DICK FOSTER 

For County Judge: 
SCOTT BAILEY (re-election) 
JOHN HART 

For County Treasurer: 
MRS. ELLEN JUSTICE 

(re-election) 

For County School Supt. 
0. L. STANLEY (re-election) 

For Representative, 63rd. District: 
JOHN E. MUSSELMAN, JR. 

BURKE MUSGROVE 

For State Senator, District 22: 

TOM CREIGHTON 
(re-election) 

 

FIRE! 

 

 

Could you afford to rebuild? 
Better check your coverage! 
Chances are, you have fire insurance — but is it ade-
quate to cover the full replacement value of farm 
buildings, equipment? Check with us, to be sure. 

INSURE TO BE SECURE! 

GORMAN INS. AGENCY 

	

Chas. L. Duran 	Berenice Jeffs 

	

DIAL RE 4-5312 
	

GORMAN 

 

  

  

    

WE HAVE PLENTY OF 

IRRIGATION PIPE 
& SUPPLIES 

Reda & Berkley Pumps 

CHECK OUR PRICES 
Before You Buy! 

TROY JOHNSON 
TRADING CENTER 

USED TRACTORS & EQUIPMENT 
USED TRUCKS & PICKUPS 

HWY. 6 WEST. 	RE4-2239 	GORMAN 

Fat Stock Show visitors in Fort 
Worth Saturday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Rogers, Sha and Wes-
ley. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Goodwin 
and family of Tolar visited Sun-
day with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Goodwin, and ob-
served Rickey's eighth birthday 
with a supper. 

DESDEMONA 
NEWS 

By MRS. ETHEL KEITH 
With the warmer weather at 

hand there was better attendance 
at the different churches the past 
Sunday. 

Quite a bit of sickness is a-
round - the flu, colds and pneu-
monia. 

Mrs. Jesse U. Elrod of Eastland 
was buried here last Tuesday. 
She was an aunt of the former 
pastor of the First Baptist 
Church, Rev. Moody Smith, now 
of Carbon. 

Mr. Don Estes has been a pa-
tient in the hospital part of last 
week. 

Mrs. Ann Patterson and Mrs. 
Carl Johnson of Eastland were 
here last Monday and had coffee 
at the cafe with a group of the 
ladies. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. 0. Fein of 
Fort Worth spent Sunday here 
with his mother, Mrs. 011ie Fein, 
and her sister, Mrs. Bonnie 
Woods of Brookville, Fla., who 
is here for an extended visit with 
Mrs. Fein and other relatives. 

Mrs. Myrtle Reid went home 
with her daughter, Mrs. Bill 
Townsend, of Baton Rouge, La., 
for an extended visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Jones of Azle 
spent Thursday and Thursday 
night here with her sister, Ethel 
Keith. 

Mrs. Laura Morrison, who had 
been here several weeks visiting 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Connell and boys, left with the 
Connells last week for Wichita 
Falls where she will visit awhile 
before going to Mexico to visit 
another daughter. 

Young Hank Connell, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Connell, left 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Ber-
nard Keith for Odessa where he 
has employment at the Chevrolet 
house there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Keith of 
Odessa spent the past weekend 
here with his mother, Mrs. Ethel 
Keith, and the Pug Gutherys. 

Visitors in the Floyd Moore 
and Lizzie Moore home during 
the week at different times were 
Mr. Geo. Moore and wife of Pos-
sum Kingdom, Mr. and Mrs. Jr. 
Moore of Fort Worth, Mr. Frank 
Moore and family of Fort Worth, 
and Kenneth Moore, also of Fort 
Worth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Irving 
and boys have moved into their 
new home here recently. It is 
located about 12 miles northwest 
of town. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Burleson, 
Cindy and Carl of Fort Worth, 
spent the weekend here visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Leroy 

Mrs. Frank Rhymes visited 
Sunday in Rising Star with her 
mother, Mrs. W. A. Williams. 

Mrs. E. R. Betterton of Abilene 
spent the weekend with her dau-
ghter, Mr. and Mrs. C. R. Day. 

The right banking connection 

is a big help to a farmer! 
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What is the "right" banking connection for a farmer? We think that 

it is with an institution like our own, where there is a thorough under-

standing of the special financial problems of farming, together with an 

attitude of wholehearted cooperation in solving them to the best advant-

age of the farmer. Whether it is a loan for machinery or livestock or any 

other needed financial service, we welcome the opportunity to prove that 

we are, indeed, the "right" bank for you! 

OUR BANKING SERVICE INCLUDES 

— CROP LOANS — EQUIPMENT LOANS — TRUCK LOANS 

— BUILDING LOANS 	— CHECKING ACCOUNTS 

— BANK-BY-MAIL 	— SAFE DEPOSIT 

aliNSIODUZEI 
THE CHEVROLET 

WAY 

We added new bushings and 
softened body-to-frame mounts 
to smooth Chevrolet's ride. We 
put in soft-acting shock 
absorbers and soft-working coil 
springs at every wheel. By soft, 
though, we don't mean mushy. 
Chevrolet's Way makes for a 
smooth, solid ride. Very steady 
on curves. A bump jumps from 
the Wide-Stance wheels to the 
supple springs and shocks—and 
pffft! It all but disappears. 

   

 

The powerfully smooth new 
Turbo-Jet V8 is available in all 
'66 Caprice, Impala SS, Impala, 
Bel Air and Biscayne models. 

 

 

Eight features now standard for 
your added safety—including 
seat belts front and back (always 
buckle up!) and an outside rear-
view mirror (always check in back 
before passing). 

 

  

GM 

        

Gum 
TEXAS Fireman  MI kinds of cars, all in one place... at your Chevrolet dealer's: Chevrolet • Chevelle • Chevy II • Corvair • Corvette 

42.3317 

SMITH BROS. CHEVROLET CO 'Oldest Dank In Eastland Cottnt9: 
GORMAN, TEXAS DIAL RE4-2233 



KING'S CHOCOLATES 
for American Queens 

Priced from 39c to $7.00 

SHELBY'S CORNER DRUG 
LEX SHELBY, Owner 

Phone RE 4-2203 - Night RE 4-2232 	Gorman 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., TEXAS, FEB. 10, 1966 BOBBY EAVES AND 
BRUCE SMITH HONORED 
WITH BIRTHDAY PARTY 

Sewing Problems 
Workshop Scheduled 
At Eastland Feb. 16 LAST WEEK OF SALE 

To make roof for our NEW SPRING MERCHAN-

DISE, we are offering our FALL & WINTER SALE 

ITEMS in all departments at GREAT REDUCTIONS. 

You must see to appreciate these fine values. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Eaves hon-
ored their son, Bobby Mark, and 
a schoolmate, Bruce Smith, with 
a party on their 12th birthday 
February 5 at the Eaves home. 

Those attending were the hon-
orees, Bobby and Bruce, Don Por-
ter, Gary Smith, Kelly Hender-
son, Billy Self, Windell Treadway, 
Danny Snider, Mark Arnold, Ted-
dy Jordan and Johnn Eaves. 

The boys gathered in the morn-
ing for a day of hunting and ex-
ploring and a picnic lunch and 
then returned to the house in the 
afternoon for birthday cake and 
punch. The cakes were heart- 

Got a sewing problem?. Then 
why not solve it. Attend the 
Sewing Problems Workshop, to 
be conducted by Mrs. Beverly R. 
Nicholson, County Home Demon-
stration Agent, and Wanda Wat- 

Gorman Texas 

shaped with the names "Bobby" 
and "Bruce" written on them. 
The Valentine theme was used 
in decorations. 

Mrs. Jackie Wheeler of Denton 
and Mrs. John Wheeler of Gor-
man attended the party in the 
afternoon. 

son, Assistant County Home Dem-
onstration Agent. 

Whether your problem be sew-
ing construction, such as setting 
in sleeves or putting in a zipper, 
or sewing with problem or new 
fabrics, such as wool, stretch 
fabrics, you may attend the work-
shop, as each individual will 
work on their own individual 
sewing problem, rather than the 
group all working on the same 
problem. 

This workshop is open to any-
one who wants to attend. There 
is no charge for the worshop. 
The only requirement is that you 
must have a knowledge of sewing 
and be able to sew a little. Each 
person attending will be required 
to furnish their own fabrics and 
supplies they will need during 
the workshop. 

The first meeting of the work-
shop will be held in Eastland in 
the Reddy Room of the Texas 
Electric Service Company on 
February 16, 1966 at 2:00-4:00 p. 
m. During this meeting plans 
will be made for the workshop 
sessions to be held during March 
throughout all areas of the county 
where interest is shown. How-
ever, in order to attend the work 
shop sessions in March, you must 
attend the first meeting on Feb. 
16th. 

Also during the February 16th 
meeting, information will be giv-
en on buying patterns, selecting 
fabrics and preparation for the 
workshop sessions. 

He invented a better way of living...electrical living! 

NOTICE! 
Plenty of New 8 5 8 Inch Casing at $1.25 per ft. 

AUTHORIZED DEALER FOR WESTERN TURBINE 

AND GOLD CROWN SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS 

(Also RAPIDAYTON - GOULD & H.T.C. SUBMERSIBLES) 

ALCOA IRRIGATION PIPE — IRECO STEELUME COUPLERS 

REASONABLE WELL TESTING 

WE ARE EQUIPPED TO SERVICE WHAT WE SELL 
Thomas A. Edison, whose birthdate each year signals 

the observance of National Electrical Week, brought 

electricity out of the laboratory and into prac-

tical use for the benefit of mankind. His in-

vention of the first practical incandescent 

lamp, and his many other inventions in the 

field of electric power generation and distri-

bution, created a new way of life and a new 

industry. Edison foresaw great things for electricity 

and for the electric industry he founded. And today 

business-managed electric companies, like 

Texas Electric Service Company, are making 

his vision come true ... constantly planning. 

building and working to provide more and 

better electric service ... for continued prog-

ress and for better living. NATIONAL E LECTRICAL WEEK 

ARDEAN KIMMEL!. 

IRRIGATION SERVICE 
FEBRUARY 6-12 

Phone 7191 	Hwy. 6 	De Leon, Texas TEXAS ELECTRIC 
SERVICE 	CO MPANY 

T. J. HALLMARK, Manager RE 4-5514 

Limited on space this week 
we hiive borrowed part of Jay's 
Gro. space o publish personals. 

OLIVER SPRINGS 
NEWS 

BY FLORENCE RICHARDSON 
Our Thought For The Week: 
The man who does his share of 

the world's work hasn't much 
time left to criticize the other 
fellows efforts. 

SHOP ONE STOP 

JAY'S 
Grocery & Market 
PHONE 5316 —:— GORMAN 

Prices Good Through Saturday 

H Tall Cans AIR SPRAY  1G4E:z SEn • 

Mellorine5lit 741 miEVAPORATED 

wiam" 	 

Miracle Whip 

WAD DRESSING 
49c Quart 

Kimbell's ZEE NAPKINS PEANUT BUTTER 
2  89c 

80 Count 	1 0 
Package C GRAPEFRUIT S POUND BAG .39 

KIMBELL'S 	3 OZ. CAN 

POTTED MEAT 	10c 
MOUNTAIN PASS 	8 OZ. CAN 

TOMATO SAUCE 	10c 
PINTO BEANS 

2 Lb. Bag 

CRISCO  3 LB. CAN .79 

wE NERs  AuRMOUR
e  
'S .49 

BISCUITS 
iiicimombe.3lli'saidor _ .39  

CALIFORNIA 

AVOCADOS 	10c 
MORTON'S 

Cocoanut, Lemon Choc. & Banana 

FR. CREAM PIES 	3—$1 
FROZEN TATER BOY 	2 LB. BAG 

French Fried Potatoes - 39c 43c Box 

The Chesley Atchisons and 
Jessie Elwin Atchison families of 
Fort Worth spent the weekend 
with their parents, the Jessie 
Atchisons. 

Glad to report that Mr. Clyde 
Setzler and Mrs. Ed Gregory are 
able to be back at home. We are 
all wishing for them a speedy 
recovery. 

Visiting the H. T. Rawls Fri-
day night were the Homer Rich-
ardsons and L. F. Miears. 

Dale Gilmore of Odessa spent 
the weekend here with relatives. 

Visiting the Clyde Setzlers over 
the weekend were the Fuzzie Ro-
bersons of Fort Worth, the Wayne 
Setzlers of Abilene, A. D. Daniels 
and Rev. Fox and wife. 

Visiting the R. H. Watsons Sun-
day afternoon were Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Burleson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arland Watson and Mr. and Mrs. 
B. A. Hirst. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Baker and 
baby of Fort Worth were visiting 
her father and family, the Rex 
Kinsers, over the weekend. 

Sorry we did not have any 
news the last two weeks, but the 
weather was so bad we did not 
get out to gather up much news. 
You can't tell about this Texas 
weather, Spring one day, next 
day real winter. 

Hisopi!IN KS 
spo CHEESE FLAVORED SNACKS 

Del Monte 

GARDEN PEAS 
5 303 cans $1.00 

Campbell's 

TOMATO SOUP 
No. 1 Can - 1 ec 

NABISCO SIP 'N CHIPS 
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