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Floyd Bradshaw, a candidate 

HULLS 
by Kernel Gene, aPe 

• 
No thanks, I do not intend to 

get mixed up in any local polit-
ical squabble. You know the can-
didates as well as I do - if you 
are a citizen of Gorman and have 
paid your poll tax, then you have 
the choice of voting according to 
the dictates of your own con-
science. This is your town and its 
future depends on you as well as 
your neighbor. As a Nation, we 
are fast losing our right to think 
and act for ourselves. Be sure 
you vote in the City Election on 
April 5th. 

• 
Mr. and Mrs. E. A. Boaz of 

Huntsville were visiting Mrs. 
Geo. Blackwell and other friends 
in Gorman last week. The Boaz' 
formerly had a department store 
where the Mehaffey Drug is now 
located. Mr. Boaz, commenting 
on Gorman, said he was surpris-
ed at all of the new homes and 
the building that continues here. 

• 
If you listen to WBAP Farm-

Editor Calvin Pigg Farm Round-
Up Program at 6:30 every morn-
ing you know all about his Soil 
Temperature Reporting Service. 
Six farmers are assisting Calvin 
with this project. They cover the 
250-mile long stretch of Texas 
Blacklands where a great part of 
the state's cotton, corn and grain 
sorghums are grown. Each farm-
er Checks the temperature of his 
own soil at planting depth and 
reports daily to Pigg. The tem-
peratures are broadcast each 
morning at 6:30 on WBAP, 820. 

"We're hoping to whet the in-
terest of more farmers in using 
soil temperature for seeding our 
principle cash crops," Pigg said. 
"Studies at Texas A&M College 
indicate that soil temperature 
plays a key role in'obtaining max 
imum germination of cotton, corn 
and grain sorghum, especially 
cotton." 

Best cotton germination is ob-
tained when the soil reaches 70 
degrees for three straight days at 
7 a. m. 

"A fancy or specialized ther-
mometer is not necessary for tak-
ing soil readings," Pigg reminded. 
"An ordinary wall type with the 
mercury fairly well exposed will 
do. It should be placed in the 
seed bed three to four inches 
deep, or about planting depth." 

• 
I don't know how this thermo-

meter business will work in East-
land and Comanche Counties but 
you might drop Calvin a line and 
ask him. •—• 
Premeasurement 
Peanuts & Cotton 
Offered Farmers 

• 

Handmade Gifts For Friends 
Becomes Profitable Business 

The old saying, "Make a better mouse trap and the world 
will beat a path to your door," is literally true with Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Burfiend, Route One, Carbon. 

Jackpot Escapes 
With $15; Worth 
$27 This Week 

The many people who were  
after "Jackpot" last week were 
unable to prevent him from slip-
ping through the tightly drawn 
net. The wise thing to do seems 
to be; add more deputies to your 
staff and stress vigilance. Form 
your own "Brigade of Vigilan-
ties." 

Again the Who's Who was 
identified, but false clues crept 
in and prevented Mr. Thearon 
Gilmore from winning the entire 
amount of $22. Only $7 was his 
reward. The "Jackpot" escaped 
with $15, making his capture 
now worth $27. So round up your 
assistants and search real hard 
for all clues and identification. 

Mr. "Quail" Thompson was our 
Who's Who last week with these 
clues: Quick to Respond; Very 
Necessary (Mr. Thompson is our 
Fire Chief), and Join the Fun. 

There can be one or more clues. 
You never can tell how many 
there, are until you track 'em 
down. 

Happy hunting! 

Livestock Show 
Opens Friday, 25( 
At Eastland 

The annual County Livestock 
Show at Eastland, March 25-26, 
with 534 animals already enter-
ed, promises to be one of the 
largest ever held in its long his-
tory, according to show officials. 

Approximately $1,500 in cash 
prizes will be distributed to the 
F. F. A. and 4-H Club boys and 
girls with prize winning animals 
during the two day affair. 

Adults are eligible to show, but 
compete for the ribbons only, it 
was said. 

Each of the junior exhibitors 
are limited to two animals in 
each fat animal class except the 
F. F. A. and 4-H Clubs. The fat 
animal division of fat pigs, fat 
lambs and fat steers is limited 
to junior exhibitors. 

The Eastland Auction Com-
pany will give three $10.00 cash 
awards to the boy or girl who 
does the best job of fitting, groom 
ing, showing and keeping the 
animal stalls and the aisles neat 
and clean during the show. 

One award wil be for swine, 
one for cattle, and one award for 
sheep. D. S. Buchanan and Lloyd 
Coan are co-owners of the East-
land Auction Company. 

Entry fees of 50 cents for sheep, 
goats and hogs, and $1.00 for 
cattle will be charged. This is a 
new ruling. Fees are to be used 
to defray expenses of the show 
and to help in construction of 
new facilities at the show 
grounds. 

Auction of the boys and girls 
prize winning fat steers, lambs 
and pigs exhibited at the show 
will be held on the last day, 
March 26, al the Eastland auction 
barn just east of that city, be-
ginning at 7:30 o'clock. 

An invitation is being extend-
ed, by George Steele, Rising Star, 
President of the Eastland County 
Livestock Raisers Assn. and spon 
sor of the show, to all who want 
to fill their deep freezers with 
top quality meat to come out and 
purchase one or more of the ani-
mals. 

A total of 19 fat steers, 139 fat 
lambs, and 125 fat pigs will be 
auctioned off. A price ceiling is 
put on each animal except the 
grand and reserve champions. 
The price ceiling depends upon 
the animal if prime, choice or 
good grade. All of the fat animals 
are graded on a packer basis, it 
was explained. 

All animals in the show must 
be entered and in their places 
by 12 o'clock on Friday, March 
25th. This rule has been rigidly 
enforced the past two years. 

Angora gnats, dairy cattle and 
the breeding classes of sheep are 
to be judged on the first after-
noon of the show. All other class-
es will be judged the second day. 

Animals will be sifted as they 
come in - by a qualified man 
from another county. Animals 
deemed to be poorly finished or 
of a quality not .a cerdit to the 
show will be sifted out and re-
turned home. 
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Final Rites For 
Mrs. A. S. Goodwin 
Held At Lamesa 

BRADSHAW IS Wedding Shower 
To Honor Miss 

CANDIDATE FOR Janet Allday 

STATE SENATOR 
A constructive Record, Not a 

Platform of Promises. 

a second term in the Texas Immediately after the services for 
Mr. and Mrs. Burfiend moved 

to Eastland County in 1951 from 
Nolan County where they had 
worked on a ranch. By May, 1955 
they were fairly well settled in 
their new home with cattle, hogs, 
goats, chickens, etc. as a source 
of income. Then the flood, winds 
and hail came. Hail six inches 
deep was measured in their front 
yard. Livestock were killed or 

in Gorman her body was taken 
to Lamesa where on Tuesday 
morning, in the funeral chapel of 
Higginbotham's at 10:00 a. 
another service for her was held. 

Interment was in the Lamesa 
Cemetery. 

Senate, is a veteran of World 
War II and has served four terms 
in the House of Representatives 
from Parker, Wise and Jack 
Counties. He is a school teacher, 
married, and has a wife and four 
children. He is a graduate of East 
Texas State Teachers College and 
a member of the Christian 
Church. 

drowned. Added to this misfor-
tune, Mrs. Burfiend underwent 
surgery and was ill for several 
months. Undaunted by these mis-
fortunes, the couple became in-
terested in molding and painting 
novelties which they gave to 
their friends. Soon the friends in-
sisted on buying these novelties 
to use as gifts. In time the Bur-
fiends began loading their car 
with Art Novelties for trips to 
the city where they found a 
ready market for their merchan-
dise. 

Questioned as to where their 
models came from, Mrs. Burfiend 
replied, "Although I have never 
had any training in art or mold 
work Fred and I just put or mind 
to it and this is the result." 

The couple are justly proud of 
their business as they are now 
receiving mail orders from all 
over the United States. Recently 
six cars from different sections 
of New Mexico were parked in 
front of their home and one Sun-
day twenty-one cars were being 
loaded with from one to many 
pieces of Art work. 

With all of their work the 
couple seldom miss services at 
the Gorman Church of Christ and 
they still take time to be good 
neighbors. 

Woman Suffrage 
Discussed By 
Excelsior Club 

Bradshaw has consistently 
worked to promote soil and water 
conservation, bet t er road s, 
schools, aid to the needy and 
benefits for veterans. He was 
author of the constitutional a-
mendment giving Texas service-
men and women the right to vote. 
While in the House of Represent-
atives Bradshaw served as Chair-
man of Education, Claims and 
Accounts and Sub-Committee for 
Junior and Senior Colleges. Upon 
being elected to the Texas Sen-
ate, he was appointed to five 
major committees. He is present-
ly Chairman of the Insurance 
Committee, Chairman of Senate 
Finance Sub-Committee, member 
of Public Health, State Affairs, 
Education and Claims and Ac-
counts. 

During the interim, he is serv-
ing on the Cost of Government 
Committee to find ways and 
means of cutting out wasteful 
and unnecessary spending and 
the Texas Educational Standards 
Commission. 

A wedding shower is to be giv-
en March 25 from 7 to 9 p. m. at 
the home of Mrs. W. T. Shell in 
Gorman. Co-hostesses will be 
Mmes. A. A. Brown, Charles Un-
derwood and L. T. Wright. Sev-
eral out-of-town guests will at-
tend the shower honoring Miss 
Allday, formerly of Gorman. 

FORT WORTH — Mr. and Mrs. 
Reece Allday, 3536 Montreal 
Circle, have announced the forth-
coming marriage of their daugh-
ter, Miss Janet Reece Allday, to 
Oliver Waddill Burns, 3770 Way-
side, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ervin 
Burns of Irene. 

Miss Allday and her fiance will 
be married at 7:30 p. m. April 15 
in Southside Church of Christ. A 
reception will be given in the 
church hall. 

Mrs. Alex Hoover will be her 
cousin's matron of honor, and 
Don L. Burkett will be best man. 

Groomsmen will be Lloyd Gil-
lis, Larry G. Garrett of Yuma, 
Ariz., Ralph E. Owen and Joe 
Wilson of Houston. Kathleen and 
Nort Truly, nieces of the pros-
pective bridegroom, will light 
the candles. 

Miss Allday is a graduate of 
Wichita Falls High School and at-
tended NTSC. Her fiance attend-
ed Arlington State College, and 
is a student at TWC. 

Mines. J. B. Morgan, Kenneth 
Arnold and Hoover will have a 
shower March 31 for the bride-
elect. 

New Hope Baptist 
Spring Revival To 
Begin Sunday, 27th 

The Spring Revival at the New 
Hope No. 2 Baptist Church will 
begin on Sunday, March 27 with 
services each evening beginning 
at 7:30. Prayer services will be 
held each evening at 7 o'clock. 

The revival, conducted by Rev. 
Pat Cummins, pastor of Warrens 
Creek Baptist Church of Hamil-
ton, will continue through April 
3rd, 

Bro. Walt Wilson, pastor of the 
New Hope Baptist, will preach 
the first two services and will 
also lead the singing in the re-
vival. 

We have this note from the 
pastor: "During these days of re-
vival we have chosen as our 
theme, 'To Be Like Jesus', which 
should be the greatest and most 
sincere desire of each of us, as 
we seek to find God's will and 
purpose for our lives. We invite 
any and all to come and worship 
with us at our church - small 
enough to know you, and large 
enough to serve you." 

Sandra Bennett 
Opens Beauty Shop 

Congratulations are in order 
for Miss Sandra Bennett upon the 
opening of her new beauty shop 
on Monday, March 21, 1960. 

Sandra is a hOmetown girl. She 
is a graduate of the 1958 class 
of Gorman High School and was 
chosen Homecoming Queen dur-
ing the homecoming festivities. 

We wish for her every success. 

Mr. Hendricks was a former 
resident of the Kokomo Com-
munity. 

Heart Attack Fatal 
To June Hendricks 

Mr. June K. Hendricks, 56, died 
of a heart attack at his home in 
Fort Worth on Thursday, March 
17, 1960. 

Funeral services were held in 
Fort Worth on Saturday morn-
ing, March 19. The body was then 
brought to the Flatwood Ceme-
tery for graveside rites and bur-
ial. 

He is survived by his wife and 
three sons, Farris of Fort Worth, 
Norris K. and Jimmy of Weath-
erford; three daughters, Mrs. 
Reba of Indiana, Annetta and 
Gracie Mae of the home, and ten 
grandchildren. 

He is also survived by one bro-
ther, Mr. Jess Hendricks of Ol-
den, a sister, Mrs. Lum Tuggle 
of the Kokomo Community, a 
sister in Arizona who was unable 
to attend the funeral due to ill-
ness, several nieces and nephews, 
including Mrs. Floyd Wood and 
Mr. Albert Hendricks of the Ko-
komo Community. 

Mrs. M. Thomas 
Buried At De Leon 

On March 18, 1960, funeral ser-
vices were held for Mrs. Mattie 
Thomas in the First Baptist 
Church of De Leon at 2 p. m. 
with Bro. Henry Chambers and 
Bro. E. P. Cummins conducting. 

Mrs. Thomas passed away in 
the Glenwood Clinic in Tyler. 
She was 94 years old. Her hus-
band, Bro. W. E. Thomas, pre-
ceeded her in death. 

Survivors include four sons, W. 
L. of De Leon, J. C. of Aransas 
Pass, A. H. of Seymour, and Bro. 
B. G. Thomas of Monitou, Okla; 
one daughter, Mrs. Luther Flynn 
of Tyler; eleven grandchildren 
and 21 great-grandchildren. 

Music was conducted by Homer 
Hawkins, Al Strassner, Jimmie 
Duncan, and Mrs. E. P. Cummins. 
Organist was Mrs. Clara Gray. 

Pallbearers were Bill Garner, 
Gene Snider, Bob Nelson, Gar-
land Thomas, J. D. Grisham, and 
Tommy Roberts. 

Interment was in the Victor 
Cemetery in De Leon. 

Hospital Report 
The following were listed as 

patients at the Blackwell Hos-
pital in Gorman on Wednesday 
morning: 

201 - W. S. Nichols, Caddo 
203 - Mrs. B. V. Martin, 

Comanche (No Visitors) 
204 - Mrs. Lloyd Chambers, 

Gorman 
205 - Mrs. Floyd Moore, Desmona 
206 - C. S. Eldridge, Desdemona 

(No Visitors) 
208 - Mrs. John T. Singleton, 

De Leon 
209 - D. W. Dingus, Comanche 
210 - Mrs. C. M. Browning, 

De Leon 
401 - Wesley Eads, De Leon 

(No Visitors) 
402 - Mrs. Thurston Thomas, 

Comanche 
403 - Mrs. H. L. Ribble, Brk'ridge 
404 - Mrs. C. E. Straley, Cmanche 
407 - Miss Laura Smith, Gorman 
409 - John Brownlee, De Leon 
411 - Cathy Wilson, De Leon 
412 - Joe Braswell, Midland 
415 - Mrs. G. A. Kinsey, Eastland 
416 - Mrs. T. Y. Gregg, Gorman 
417 - Mr. & Mrs. Gus Myers, 

Comanche 
418 - R. J. Guthery, Irving 
419 - W. H. Snell, Carbon 

should reach the county office 
not later than May 10, 1960, Mr. 
Bryant said. At the time of ap-
plication, the farmer will be ask-
ed to deposit sufficient funds to 
cover cost of the work. The cost 
has been set at $10.00 per farm. 
plus $4.00 for each plot over one. 

ITEMS OF 
INTEREST 

ISSUE DATES FOR USDA 
SURPLUS FOOD ANNOUNCED 

On Tuesday night in the home 
of their president, Mrs. Fannye 
Burkett, members of the Excel-
sior Club met for their regular 
meeting. 

Topic of discussion was Woman 
Sufferage. "Has Woman Suffer-
age made our World a Better 
Place?". Mrs. Carroll Bickle 
spoke on "Invasion in Politics". 
The first woman to enter into 
politics and started the Woman 
Sufferage movement was Susan 
B. Anthony. She gave a short 
story of her life and works. Next 
came the story of the only wom-
an in the U. S. who ever ran for 
President, Mrs. Beva Lockwood. 
She was a lawyer and was suc-
cessful in getting a, bill passed 
admitting women to practice be-
fore the U. S. Supreme Court and 
in that same year she was the 
first woman permitted to do so. 
She became the nominee for pres-
ident of the Equal Rights Party 
in 1884 and in 1888. The two 
women were the leaders in their 
field. 

Mrs. Check Smith spoke on the 
subject "Effect on Home Life." 
How, in the busy work-a-day 
routine a woman influences the 
world around her. The way she 
teaches her children, her work in 
the community, and with her 
family in church activities. The 
results may be far more reaching 
than can be immediately realized 
but in the overall picture a wom-
an's influence in politics' may 
show up in various ways. 

The club members thoroughly 
enjoyed seeing a film dealing 
with Radio Free Europe. It was 
very enlightening. Very few peo-
ple realize the magnitude of the 
work and results accomplished 

The next issue dates for 
USDA Surplus Foods in Eastland 
will be as follows: 

Any farmer wishing to have 
his fields measured officially in 
advance of planting peanuts and/ 
or cotton to assure compliance 
with acreage allotments should 
apply as soon as possible to his 
county Agricultural Stabilization 
and Conservation Office, Chair-
man William F. Bryant announc-
ed. 

Under the premeasurement pro 
gram, regular ASC performance 
reporters measure the fields. The 
premeasured acreages will be ac-
cepted as official for all ASC pur-
poses provided no obvious error 
is made and proviled the fields 
are planted as measured. A later 
trip to the farm will be made to 
determine that these require-
ments have been met, but in most 
cases an additional survey will 
not be necessary. 

The purpose of premeasure-
ment, Mr. Bryant said, is to help 
the farmer guard against either 
overplating or underplanting his 
crop allotment. Overplanting. 
either through inaccurate meas-
urement by the farmer or 
through incorrect unnecessary 
expense for fertilizer, seen and 
soil treatment. Underplanting 
can cause loss of farm income. 

Requests for premeasurement 

Funeral services for Mrs. Alma 
Sue Goodwin were held on Mon-
day, March 21, 1960 in the Con-
gregational Methodist Church at 
10:30 a. m. with Bro. Marion Den-
nis conducting. She was born 
August 3, 1907. 

On February 17, 1954 she was 
married to Walter Goodwin in 
Lamesa, Texas, where she had 
lived most of her life. 

Mrs. Goodwin has been a mem-
ber of the Methodist Church since 
she was twelve years of age. 

Survivors include her husband; 
one daughter by a former mar-
riage, Mrs. Lou Nell Marchbanks 
of El Monte, California; a step 
son, Walter J. Goodwin of Big 
Spring; two sisters, Mmes. Lois\ 
Cates of Lubbock and Audine 
Owens of Pecos; five grandchil-
dren; one niece and one nephew. 

Pallbearers were Claud Dennis, 
Fred Rodgers, Odis Rodgers, Her-
man Eison, Crawford Thurman, 
and Tidy Eaves. 

Monday, April 11 - Eastland, 
Olden and Ranger. 

Tuesday, April 12 - Rising Star, 
Pioneer, Okra, Carbon, Gorman, 
and Desdemona. 

Senator Bradshaw was author 
of several insurance reform laws 
that brought about strict regula-
tion that put many insolvent 
companies out of business. He 
was author of two Bills that re-
pealed several hundred old out-
dated laws that hampered the 
freedom and operation of local 
county government. Bradshaw 
has vigorously opposed restric-
tive regulatory laws promoted by 
special int_west groups. 

Some of the laws sponsored by 
the Bradshaw are listed here for your 

consideration. Rebuilt fire-trap 
Deaf Mute school; relocated and 
rebuilt old Blind, Deaf and Or-
phan School for colored children: 
New training school at Gates-
ville to segregate young offend-
ers from hardened juvenile re-
peaters; flood control and water 
improvement district in Eastland, 
Denton, Jack, Palo Pinto, Wise, 
and Parker Counties; resolution 
creating agency to handle surplus 
property for schools and school 
lunch program. Bradshaw has 
been active in supporting meas-
ures to enact animal health legis-
lation that would benefit the 
farmer, dairyman, and rancher. 

Floyd Bradshaw is opposed to 
Federal as well as State Central-
ization and interference in the 
operation of our schools, business 
and local affairs, and will con-
tinue to fight to maintain our 
freedom in such matters. He is 
well known as a quiet and ef-
fective leader in helping solve 
the major problems that come 
before the Legislature. 

Your vote and support of Floyd 
Bradshaw, for State Senator, will 
be sincerely appreciated. 

Wednesday, April 13 - Cisco, 
Scranton and Nimrod. 

SINGING AT KOKOMO 
SUNDAY, MARCH 27 

The regular fourth Sunday 
Singing will be held at Kokomo 
on Sunday, March 27. 

All singers and lovers of good 
gospel music are cordially invited 
to attend. 

by the broadcasts to people be-
hind the iron curtain. It is a film 
every American should see. It 
should make each one of us who 
saw it want to "hug our Consti-
tution" closer to us. 

Thanks go to Mr. Check Smith 
for operating the projector for us. 

We were served a delicious re-
freshment plate before biding 
goodnight to our hostess. 
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Drive it-it's fun-tastic! See your local authorized Chevrolet dealer for fast delivery, favorable deals. 
• -•..••••• 

SMITH BROS. CHEVROLET CO. Texas  
Phone 26 

Eastland Co., TEXAS, MARCH 

KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS. 24, 1960 Mrs. Lawrence Collins of Rankin 
and Mr. and Mrs. Euell Allison 
and Alvie visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. 0. N. Justice. 

Mr. and Mrs. Barton Eppler of 
Gorman visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. W. A. O'Neal on Saturday 
night. Rev. Jackie Heath visited 
with the O'Neals on Sunday after 
noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Wood, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wilbourne Wood and 

L Terri of Carbon, Mrs. Mary Tim-
mons and Mrs. Edward Stacy -of 
Carbon, Mrs. Ruth Bryant and 
Mrs. Joyce Eaves visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hendricks 
last week. 

Mrs. Tom Lasater and Jerry of 
Eagtland were visiting with Mrs. 
W. F. Bryant on Sunday morn-
ing. 
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KOKOMO NEWS 
By Mrs. Glenn Jordan 

Mr .and Mrs. Jake Caraway 
were dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Victor Pack on Thursday. 
Mrs. Delman Eaves and children 

visited with the Packs on Satur-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Bryant, 
Charles and Larry, and Mrs. W. 
F. Bryant visited in De Leon, on 
Saturday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Harettan and children. 

On Saturday niaht Mr. and 
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BIG MIKE DOG FOOD 3-25c 

VAN CAMP TUNA flat can 19c 

ZEE NAPKINS 2-25 

611 C 
NORTHERN TISSUE 3 - 27c 

ORANGE JUICE 46 oz 29c 

MR. CLEAN reg. size 37c 
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and 
son of Carbon were dinner guests 
of her sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Euell Allison and Alvie. on 
Sunday. Mr. and Mrs. Jim Jor-
dan were visiting with them in 
the afternoon. 

Abilene an Mrs. 
Tommy Webb of 

Mrs. Delman Eaves 
Mr. and m  

and children were visiting with 
Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Eaves on 
Sunday. 

Mrs. E. B. Foster of De Leon 
visited with her sister, Mrs. Lon 
Snider on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Theron Gilmore 
of Gorman spent Sunday with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Buford 
Parker. 

Those from the community at-
tending the singing at Gorman 
on Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
John Donaldson, Mrs. W. F. Bry-
ant, Mrs. Carra Sessum, Mrs. 
Nancy Hendricks and Sylvia, Mr. 
and Mrs. 0. N. Justice, and Mr. 
John W. Henderson. 

Glenn Jordan was a business 
visitor to Fort Worth on Monday. 

Mr. Henry Scitern didn't get to 
come home over the week end 
but hopes to soon. 

Mr. W. A. O'Neal received 
word on Monday that his cousin, 
Mr. Fred Wallace, 46, died of a 
heart attack in Alaska on Sun-
day. The body will be returned 
here for burial, but arrangements 
are incomplete at this writing. 
Sympathy is extended to the 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Hendricks 
of Olden spent Thursday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Tidy Eaves. They 
spent Friday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lum Tuggle. 

Several from the community 
attended the funeral of Mrs. Wal-
ter Goodwin at Gorman on Mon-
day morning. Mr. and Mrs. Tidy 
Eaves went to Lamesa for Mrs. 
Goodwin's burial there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Delman Eaves 
made a trip to Ft Worth on Tues-
day. 
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Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Akers of 
Odessa visited the Bowles family 
this week. 

Mrs. Frank Dean is visiting her 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Ormsby of Borger. 

Mrs. Adcock is visiting her 
sons in Borger. 

Mrs. John Webb visited her 
mother, Mrs. Marvin Roberts 
here last week. 
' Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Barr of 
Bonham recently spent four days 
with- their daughter and family, 
Rev. and Mrs. John Dowd and 
grandson, Mark. 

Visiting Mrs. Ethel Walker and 
Jean Hallum Sunday were Mr.  
and Mrs. Orbrey Walker and son 
Leslie Glenn and Mr. John W. 
Walker Jr. all of Fort Worth. 

Mr. Brawner Lee Files return-
ed home last Friday from a ten 
day visit in Houston with Mr. 
and Mrs. Jan Acrea. He also vis-
ited in the home of his cousin, 
Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Files. 

Visitors in the First Baptist 
Church last Sunday were Mrs. 
Calvin Swan of Brownwood, Mr. 
and Mrs. Park of Rotan. 

Mr. and Mrs. L, N. Koen and 
son Randy of Abilene visited her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Jack Maun-
ey Sunday and attended church 
with them. 

Severay from the community 
attended the funeral of Mr. June 
Hendricks at the Flatwood Ceme-
tery on Saturday afternoon. We 
extend hinceer sympathy to the 
Hendricks family. 

Rev, and Mrs. Jackie Heath 
and children and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lon Snider were guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Snider on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Fuller and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Mor-
row and Larry, and Mrs. John 
Wheeler were dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Eaves on 
Sunday. 

Visitors at the Kokomo Baptist 
Church on Sunday morning were 
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Henderson 
of Staff, Mrs. Letha Rogers and 
Mr. D. B. Crawley. Mrs. Carra 
Sessum was a visitor on Sunday 
night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Brown 
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JIMMIE F. DEAN 

COMPLETES COURSE IN 

COMPANY TRAINING IN NY MILK See us for lube 
work that you can rely on AND OTHER FINE 

DAIRY PRODUCTS 	 

NEW YORK - Jimmie F. Dean. 
a professional service represent-
ative of Pfizer Laboratories, a 
division of Chas. Pfizer & Co.. 
Inc., recently attended a two-
week company training session in 
Clifton, N. J. 

Mr. Dean. a pharmacy graduate 
of Texas University, joined the 
company in August. He and his 
wife, Beatrice, have a daughter, 
Cassandra, and live at 4403 Mon-
ty Drive, Midland, Texas. 

Editors Note: Jimmie is the son 
of Mrs. J. Frank Dean of Gorman. 

BUY THEM AT 
THESE ESTABLISHMENTS: 

Like all our other wyk . . . when it comes to lube 
jobs . . we touch all bases. You get what you ex-
pect here: You will learn we take pride in doing our 
best. 

LET US WASH AND GREASE YOUR CAR 

Ease The Wear and Tear of Stop and Go 

Station Bennett's Grocery & 
Brown Jug Cafe 

Jay's Grocery & Market 

t`61 

CGS 

f.,s Ormsby's Grccory & Market 
tGi 

+61
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Jack Boyd, 
SALESMAN 
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tat 
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) Phone 

We Can Perk Up Your Winter 

Weather-Worn Battery. 

Drive In or Give Us A Call 
J. T. Gregory 

Distributing Co. 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

EASTLAND 
CHIROPRACTIC 

OFFICE 
Office hours 9 to 5 p.m. 

Closed Thurs. - Sat. at noon 

DR. R. G. VERHETSEL, D.C. 

101 S. Hillcrest - Eastland 
Phone 536 

JOHNSON TEXACO 
SERVICE STATION 

rm 

(tn 

Gorman 

WESLEY SPIVEY, Operator 
We Give B & B Stamps 

225 	 Hwy. 6 s€4 We Appreciate Your Patronage 
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See The Dinah Shore Chevy Show in color Sundays, NBC-TV--The Pat Boone Chevy Showroom weekly, ABC-TV 

+An 

k.S4X;X•:<",k1c.,  

eitstiTh1774q1K-1)Mksh\s  

..izt9;t(5?'"'.  
• 

Nzt ••$. 

Ian load space with the rear scat folded. And 
when that's full you can start on the trunk. 

Corvair, you see, is no ordinary compact 
car. No others are so versatile, so ingeniously 
engineered-with independent suspension at 
all four wheels, an air-cooled rear engine 
that never needs water or antifreeze. You just 
can't compare anything else coming out 
these days with a Corvair. Drive one ... soon. 

For economical corvair transportation— 	BY CHEVROLET 

SIX-PASSENGER 
CAR OR 

STATION SEDAN 
...CORVAIR IS BOTH! 

A wonderfully useful fclding seat makes every 
Corvair two cars in one. Just one quick flip and you 
increase the luggage and parcel space to 28.9 cubic 
feet. And just as simply, you're back to comfortable 
six-passenger capacity. It's standard  equipment 
... and extraordinarily practical. 

Corvair does car-pool duty with the biggest 
and best of them. Going to work or school or 
out for the evening, you've got a genuine 
six-seater. As for carting around piles of stuff 
instead of people, just look at Corvair's station- 

• ELECTRIC WASHER-DRYER 
• 

‘4,..\\\4•6 :  

the Electric Washer-Dryer fits into 

most kitchens or utility rooms, re-

gardless of size. In some homes to-

day, it finds a place in the bathroom, 

handy to the clothes hamper and 

linen closets. For big help in a small 

space, check the advantages of an 

Electric Washer-Dryer! 

, 	=‘, 
• 

Ik\LILi This is the Corrair 700 4-Door Sedan 

If your home is compact, with limit-

ed room for additional appliances, 

you'll welcome the space-saving 

convenience of an Electric Washer-

Dryer. It both washes and dries 

clothes in one compact unit that can 

be installed in a width of 36 inches 

or i.ess. Because of its compactness, 

'•••• 

)Al•emkrzst.msm.rwssmtievolsioe,' 
r 	. 	: 

See Your Electric Appliance Dealer 
ttt: if-5 

e`fes,!oN' TEXAS ELECTRIC SERVICE COMPANY 
T. J. HALLMARK, Manager 	 Phone 121 
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THE GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., TEXAS, MARCH 24, 1960 LOCAL DIST. DEPUTY PRES. 
OF REBEKAHS ATTENDS 
STATE ASSEMBLY. FT WORTH 

NOTICE - We do first class renovat-
ing on mattresses. We make new cot-
ton and innerspring mattresses. Prit-
chard Mattress Factory. Phone 6841. 
De Leon. Free Pick-up & Delivery. 	fu Born After His Daddy Died - 
MATTRESSES REBUILT — Have your 
old mattress made like a new beau-
tiful innerspring mattress. Prices are 
reasonable, work guaranteed. Eppler's 
Furniture Store of Gorman represent-
ing Summers & Son Mattress Co. of 
Stephenville. Texas 

WANT ADS 
MARKET-PUCE 
OF (MILLIONS.." 
tate& 

e DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE 
— Hamilton Rendering Co. —
Free and Sure — Call Collect 

Phone 303, Hamilton, Texas. fn 

MONUMENTS FOR SALE 
Guaranteed Monument Co. 
ARNOLD BUTLER, Rep. 

. . . . did little Tommy cloud the title to his mother's 
home? Or suppose little Tommy was born out of wedlock 
would this affect the titles to the properties owned, if any, 
by his father. or mother, or both? These and many other 
heirship problems may arise in any title which the lawyers 
or the courts must finally decide. The abstract, which pre-
sents the facts and conditions surrounding such circum-
stances, is and always has been, the most important part 
of any real estate transaction. For the newer varieties of Peach 

and Pecan Trees come to our 
place. Open on Sundays after one 
p. m. Womanck's Nursery, (on 
Hwy. 6 near Rucker) De Leon, 
Texas. 	 12-31fnc 

Earl Bender & Company 
EASTLAND 	!Abstracts Since 1923) 	TEXAS 

'.11.•111W,t1=11=11:16.-1111134 
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We stock Sylvania Silver Screen 
85 TV Picture Tubes; Philco TV 
and Radios. Authorized factory 
service man for Philco. Phone 4 
for service. Todd's Variety Store, 
Gorman. 	 6-12i-nc 

Mrs. A. C. Files, District Dep-
uty President of District No. 46 
of the Rebekah Lodge, attended 
the State Assembly meeting at 
Fort Worth March 20 through 
March 22nd. 

The President of International 
Assembly of Rebekah Lodges 
from Alabama, President of State 
Assembly of Arkansas and New 
Mexico, along with a number of 
visitors from out of state, attend-
ed. 

At the Sunday luncheon honor-
ing the Grand Master of Inter-
national Odd Fellows, Mr. E. 0. 
Richard of Nebraska, there was 
a record crowd and he was hav-
ing trouble getting through and 
into the dining room. Some of the 
officials pushed through asking 
that a passage be opened up for 
Clark Gable. He had no further 
ttouble getting to his place of 
honor. (To tell the truth, he real-
ly does look like Clark Gable). 

There were more than 2.000 
registered for the meeting, one of 
the largest number to attend such 
a function. 

The next meeting of the IOOF 
Grand Lodge and the Rebekah 
Assembly is scheduled to be held 
in Austin next year. 

• 

It is essential 
that a prescription be 
filled carefully 

"Some of this applied to the cow and some of that put in 
the ground and all of the farmer's troubles will be over?" 

"Not exactly, Mr. Jobe," stated Mr. Shahan in the white 
shirt, "But . . !" 

. . • and there were many BUTS clarified at a Brush and 
Fertilizer Control demonstration program in D. J. Jobe's 
building Tuesday night. 

Left to right: Dr. Ivan E. Miles, agronomist, and Jimmie 
L. Gillen, field representative, both with Olin Mathieson 
Chemical Corp., Houston, Texas; Harold E. Shahan, repre-
sentative for Estes Chemicals, Inc., Wichita Falls, and James 
Jobe, Gorman, examining chemicals and fertilizer used dur-
ing the demonsration.  

Listening and talking with these representatives one for-
gets they are just doing a job because their enthusiasm and 
interest in trying to assist the farmer in preserving his land 
and protecting their livestock gives one a feeling that: "here 
are men dedicated to serve." While their respective com-
panies spend thousands of dollars in research, these men 
travel hundreds of miles and work far into the night trying 
to give farmers the benefit of their knowledge, and the 
companies experiments. , 

i 	Dr. Miles spoke with pride when he said, "Olin Mathieson 
has the largest fertilizer plant in the world." 

440 Your registered pharmacist carefully measures and 
tests all the ingredients specified for your benefit 
in your doctor's prescription. Accuracy is imperative! 

LIGHT CRUST FLOUR 5 th  43c 

RANCH STYLE BACON  'lb 99c  

SUPREME COOKIES  2  lb box  59 

DR. 	PEPPER Plus Del"s"  6 - 1 9C 

• We put at your doctor's 

command, the results of 

all the latest develop-

ments in medical re-

search. 
S 

S 

T. E. L. CLASS HOLDS 
REGULAR MEETING 

LI  

s 

MEHAFFEY DRUG The T. E. L. Class of the First 
Baptist Church held their reg-
ular meeting on March 17th. with 
a covered dish luncheon. Visitors 
were Bro. Kyle and family. Mrs. 
Cynthia Earles and Mr. C. 0 
Huff and Mr. Evin Martin. Bro. 
Kyle expressed thanks. 

After lunch the meeting was 
called to order by President, 
Emily Yates. Mrs. Will Capers 
lead in prayer. Bro. Kyle read 
the 8th. Chapter of Hebrews and 
lead in prayer. 

Mrs. Yates read 100 Psalms. 
Mrs. Jim Wood lead in prayer. 

The class voted to give the 
quilt they quilted to The Kirk's 
Nursing Home. Another quilt 
project is on hand. 

Miss Buena Van Winkle played 
and sang "My God Is Real". Mrs. 
Maud Huff closed the meeting 
with a prayer. 

Those of the class present were 
Mmes. Jim Wood, Jimmie War-
ren, Vesta Weeden, Evin Martin, 
Myrtle Duke, Maud Huff, and 
Miss Van Winkle. 

"Where Friends Meet" 
Phone 55 Gorman 

BEEF AND CHICKEN 

PICTSWEET  PIES  4-$1 

RED POTATOES 10 lb' bag 49c 

1111•1111•1• 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Night Phone 24J 	Day 11 
Political 

Announcements 
The Gorman Progress has been DEADLINE - MARCH 31 

CAR LICENSE 
authorized to announce candi-
dates for public office in the 
Democratic primary election as 
follows: 

We have a complete line of 
Nursery Stock. Drive to our Nur-
sery for your Pecan Trees, Fruit 
Trees, Shrubs and Evergreens. 
We do landscaping. Womack's 
Nursery, (on Hwy. 6 near Rucker) 
De Leon, Texas. 	12-31fnc mos GROCERY & MARKET The Certificate of Title and 1959 License Receipt 

MUST be presented when you purchase your 
Phone 40 

FOR CONGRESSMAN: 
17th. District, Texas: 

ROY SKAGGS, Abilene 
R. M. (Bob) WAGSTAFF 

of Abilene 

We Deliver 
MATTRESSES RENOVATED —
Save up to 50%. Guaranteed. 
Choice size, firmness. Matching 
box springs made by Western 
Mattress Company. Write Box 
5288, San Angelo, or phone Del. 
ma's Beauty Shop, 229W2, Gor- 
man. 	 1-14fnc 

1960 LICENSE 
FOR SHERIFF: 

Lee Horn 
W. E. Reid 
J. B. Williams (re-election) 
0. M. (Hop) White 

1960 License May Be Purchased At - - 

Who's Who 
in Gorman 

TODD'S VARIETY STORE FOR SALE — House, modern 
conveniences, 	100 ft. front lot. 
1/2 block in rear. E. F. McCor- 
mack, Phone 72-W. 	1-14fnc 

FOR TAX ASSESSOR- 
COLLECTOR: 

J. C. Allison (re-election) 
Authorized Dealer For PHILCO TV & Radio 

"AUTHORIZED FACTORY SERVICE MAN" 
We Give S & H Green Stamps 

Gorman, Texas Phone 4 
HIGGINBOTHAM'S 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Night Phone 24.1 	Day 11 

FOR STATE REP. 
76TH. DISTRICT: 

Paul Brashear (re-election) 
Don Kincaid 
Scott Bailey 

FOR SALE — 6-room house, 
modern conveniences, re-model-
ed, glassed-in sleeping porch. —
4-room house, bath and wash 
porch, remodeled inside. — One 
lot 90x180, south front, one block 
east of school. Other lots avail-
able. Lots and houses priced to 
sell. Will move houses to town. 
J. C. Seaton, 	miles north on 
Desdemona Hwy. or see W. G. 
Baker Feed Store and he will 
give directions. 	2-25f tic 
•	 
WANTED — Gardens to Plow. 
Will use a small tractor. Write 
or see Vernon Warren, Rt. 2, 
Gorman. 	 3-24p 

WHERE TO LOOK FOR CLUES 
FOR STATE SENATOR 
22ND. DISTRICT: 

Toni Creighton 

Floyd Bradshaw 
for 2nd. Term 

Clues may be hidden in ANY ad in this group ad. When a 
Star appears in any of these ads, it means that additional 
advertising of that merchant appears elsewhere in this issue 
of the paper, and additional clues may be hidden in any of 
those ads, also! 

Clues will be scattered .. . there may be from one to five 
clues in any ad - or none. This is a contest of skill - and we 
intend to do our best to outwit you. We invite you to do 
your best to outwit us! 

Copyright 1959 by B. Reinhardt. All rights reserved. 

FOR CONSTABLE, Precinct Five 
E. L. (Jug) DENNIS, re-election 
BILL PARTEN Congratulations 

Neighb rs • 
FOR SALE — New Rear Trac-
tor Tires. 12.4x36 with rims if 
you need them. A bargain for 
quick zale. Ranger Farm Store, 
Ranger, Texas. 	 3-25c 

CITY OFFICES 
Election Day, April 5, 1960 

For Mayor 
T. L. (Dick) Jay (re-election) 
E. E. Todd 

For Commissioner 
Gabe Wright (re-election) 
James W. Miears 

TODD'S VARIETY 
Authorized Philco Dealer 

S & H Green Stamps 

r. & Mrs. E. E. Todd Ph. 4 
Hardware Lumber 

FOR SALE — Floor sample GE 
-  Home Freezer - Up Right 18 cu. 

Furniture 	 ft. Reg. price $399.95. To close 
out, $299.95. No down payment, 
24 months to pay. Ranger Farm 
Store, Ranger, Texas. 	3-25c JAY'S 

GROCERY & MARKET 

Friendly Service 
Throughout The Years 

HOME FOR SALE - 2-bedroom. 
bath, living room, kitchen an• 
den combination. Car port. See 
J. E. Lawrence. 	3-24p 

Gorman Texas 

Dry Goods - Shoes 
Sportsman. 

Ready-to-Wear Phone 40 	We Deliver LelirtOw..-t-  • 0-4.401,..nr...„9-aco.,,e,..0.,,0„.01 FOR SALE — New House - 4 
rooms and bath, storage and car-
port. Plenty of built-ins. Might 
consider renting. See A. B. Hunt, 
Gorman. 	 ltp 

J. W. MIEARS, Consignee Dr. Fehrmon H. Lund 
Optometrist 

Eye Examinations — 
Prescribing of Lenses 

— Visual Rehabilitation 

Mobil 
Products 

ORMSBY'S GROCERY 
A Dependable Source of 
High Quality Products FOR SALE — Station, Grocery 

and property with good well of 
water in Staff, near Lake Leon.  
Also cabin and lot south side of 
bridge on Lake Leon. Contact J. 
W. Mounce, Box 294, Gorman. 

Joe Ormsby 	Phone 22 Phone 42-R2 	Gorman MAin 9-1177 405-6 Exchange Bg 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

01.491.49a,0,‘ano-.49 ,4,,„  
ROBERTSON 

GULF STATION THE TIME SHOP 

Watch Repairing & Jewelry 

Mr. & Mrs. 0. N. Justice 
93 

Gas - Oil - Greasing 
S & H Green Stamps 

Hwy. 6 	 Phone 

THOMPSON'S HARDWARE 

WINDSHIELDS 

INSTALLED 

In All Makes 

of Automobiles 

May we compliment you, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Burfiend, on 

your success. Your efforts prove that unlimited opportunities 

await the people of our Nation who are willing to use initia-

tive and work toward a goal. 

SMITH BROS. 
CHEVROLET CO. 

Sales -CHEVROLET- Service Quality - Not Price 

Home Owned 	Phone 157 Phone 26 	 Gorman All Work Guaranteed 
We Give Free Estimates 

HENDERSON'S VARIETY WRIGHT BROS. 
IMPLEMENT CO. 

Gfer---T2r-1' /aria Gomm 

FirS' woOS, TEXAS 
"Oldest Bank In 'Eastland Count" BEGGS PAINT & BODY SHOP 

110 Gonzales 
 

DE LEON 	Phone 3851 
Headquarters For Gifts 

Toys & School Supplies 
Massey-Ferguson Dealer 

Gabe Wright 	Phone 139 

-ezr-rze"-•CCr-•C•CCe--ezez•c•Cr-.C.C.C.C.C.Cea-r-er-e--e- • 



Mr. and Mrs. Bill Owens of 
Odessa spent a part of last week 
with his mother, Mrs. Agnes 
Owens. 

Word was received nere last 
week that Mrs. W. C. Bedford 
had passed away. 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., TEXAS, MARCH 24. 1960 Little Charles Fonville, son of 
Mrs. Murel Fonville, is belfast 
now since January with Rheu-
matic fever. 

The W. H. Davis' were in Cisco 
on Saturday to visit with Mrs. 
Tickner and to offer sympathy 
to the bereaved family of the 
loss of their father and husband, 
Rev. Tickner. 

Mrs. Dess Abernathy and Mrs. 
Agnes Owens attended the funer-
al of Mr. Young on Tuesday. 

Redecoration work on the Bap-
tist parsonage has almost been 
completed and will soon be ready 
for occupancy by the new pas-
tor, Rev. Smith, formerly of De 
Leon. 

Mr. C. S. Eldridge suffered a 
heart attack several days ago and 
is a patient in the Gorman hos-
pital. He is reported in fair con-
dition. 

Mrs. Elsie Norris of Dublin 
visited with her mother, Mrs. 
Ida Wilhite, one day last week. 

Mrs. Floyd Moore entered the 
Gorman hospital early Monday 
to undergo surgery. 

Mr. Rob Guthery is a patient 
in the Gorman hopsital. 

Joe Merrill, Jr. and family of 
Ft Worth spent the weekend 
here with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Merrill, Sr. 

Miss Charlene Stacy, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Buddie Stacy, is 
a patient in the Gorman hospital 
suffering from the flu. 

Mrs. Myrt Reid has recently re-
turned home from a 45 day visit 
with her children. The first visit 
was a month in Pennsylvania 
with her daughter, Billie Martin 
and family, and then in Louisiana 
with Iris June Townsend and 
family in Baton Rouge, and also 
in Alvin with Phil Reid and fam-
ily. 

Mr. H. T. Lane spent last week 
in Eastland with her mother, Mrs. 
Amanda Rogers, who has been 
quite ill for some time. She is 
now reported quite improved. 

Mrs. Joe Ben Koonce was at 
the bedside of her father, Mr. 
Loyd Kirkland, on Monday of 
this week in Dublin when he 
went into surgery for the ampu-
tation of his leg.' The other leg 
had been amputated several 
months ago. 

Mr. Rodney Reid of Calif. and 
Mrs. Eddie Williamson spent the 
weekend here with their cousin, 
Mrs. Myrt Reid. While here the 
group drove around down near 
their "old stomping grounds" for 
an outing. 

'•imminimmararr css. 	 DESDEMONA 
NEWS 
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THE TIME SHOP 
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No Long Waits. 

G 
4 

Watch Repairing To A Science 
ETHEL KEITH, Reporter 

The attendance has been low 
the past two weeks at our school. 

Mr. Homer Abernathy return-
ed home Saturday after spend-
ing a week in the Harris Hospital 
at Ft Worth and is reported with 
some improvement in his con-
dition. 

Income Tax 
Service 

4> 
4> 
4> 
4> 

4> 
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We carry a Complete Line of 
standard Jewelry Store Merchan-
dise, Watch Repair & Materials. See ARLTON E. SMITH 

At SMITH DRUG 
=RIMMENIINWSISCL 

—x110. 	 

MR. & MRS. 0. N. JUSTICE 	GORMAN, TEXAS Mr. and Mrs. Doc Finley of 
Carlton and Mr. and Mrs. Clint 
Richburg of Grand Prairie visit-
ed Tuesday with their aunt. Sally 
Eaton. _seilerligessum.as air  
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LORETTA CAROL BAKER 

WED TO RONNIE CREED 

Mrs. Carl Cox of Stephenville 
wishes to announce the marriage 
of her daughter, Loretta Carol 
Baker, also of Stephenville, to 
Mr. Ronnie Creed of De Leon. 

The couple were married in 
Gorman on Tuesday afternoon, 
March 15th. 

IMPERIAL SUGAR 10 lb° 9.05 
Huns PEACHES 21/4  can pi 

KIMBELL'S SALT 	2 - 25c 
HUNTS CATSUP Hoz. 2-25c 

Those attending were Mrs. Cox, 
mother of the bride, and Mrs. 
Mac Curb of Gorman. 

„zzgat: 
What spiraling prices 
do to your home... 

and how you 
can lick 'ern! 

Since prices continue to spiral 
up and up, it would probably 
cost you a lot more to replace 
your home now than it cost 
you to build it. Would your 
present insurance cover you at 
today's high prices? Make sure 
you're fully protected. Call us 
for a complete property insur-
ance checkup. 

We Give S & H Green Stamps 

"IT'S A NEW MODEL - - ALL CHROME 
WITH A LITTLE PAINT TRIM'.  

When it comes to cars, some like 'em fancy, some 
like 'em plain . . . some like 'em large, some like 'em 
small. It's all a matter of taste! But when it comes 
to service, it's a matter of good judgement to come 
here . . . where you're always sure of a friendly wel-
come and heads-up attention to your needs. 

The groom is employed with 
the Golden Oak Feed Mill in De 
Leon. They are also making De 
Leon their home. 

Robertson 
Gulf Service Station 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
Cor. Kent St. & Hwy. 6 	 Phone 93 

C. H. Robertson 	Night Phone 1483 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

YORK APPLES 11b.  He 
VINEGAR 	hit. loc 

Gorman 
Insurance Agency 

Night Phone 24J 	Day Ph. 11 
W. G. Kirk 	Berenice Jeffs 

Phone 134 	 Gorman 10% OFF on All 
King James Dry Goods -i r=--r 	I 1=-r r=-.- ..1=-1 r==. r•=1 r  rr--I 	rr.=J 	•J-•  r=. rr-J r-T 

OUR EVERY DAY LOW PRICES 
Representing the 
Hartford Fire 
Insurance Company 
Crotip "200 in the air... 

g everywhere 
11 

VANDERVOORT'S MILK gal 85c 
KIMBELL'S BISCUITS 3 cans 25c 

BARNETT'S 

tiAL 

SC,  
ft 

Standard 
protection 

V LISS 

JUST ARRIVED! New Shipment of Spring 
DRESSES - PURSES - GLOVES - CAN CANS 

And LOVELY MATERIALS Grocery & Service Station Rod 0 NUTS 
47 	

0 z 

YOU MUST HAVE 

BOAT 
t 

REGISTRATION 
NUMBERS 
by April 1, '60 

Mr. & Mrs. Gene Barnett 	 Hwy. 6, East 

a!!! !EZtalL 

Perfect for 
your Easter 

Shopping FLOORCOVERING VALUES 
MD FICORCOVERING  SAVINGS warata. Go  Together  

Brighten Up Your Home For Spring With The 

NEWEST IN NYLON CARPET 
According to the Federal 
Boating Act, all boats with 
over 10 horsepower motors 
are required to have boat 
numbers this year. Numbers 
must be properly placed and 
clearly legible to comply 
with the law. 

installed over 
40 oz. padding 

BE READY 
FOR THE 

EASTER 
PARADE 

FOR THE VERY 

LAST WORD IN 

WORKMANSHIP 

IF YOU ARE ALWAYS ON 

THE GO - THESE DRESSES 

ARE FOR YOU 

GET YOUR BOAT 

REGISTRATION FORMS, 

INFORMATION, 

BOAT NUMBERS AT . . . for only 
$529 sq. yd. 

4 1377 	
11; y.  

re/  sh: 	 °till  Itt  
.CfVe 

trYyt• .:1.1.1'.ect-4,„Y:,h-nrizifitntre  41. ; 

d7W,6?etts,..gt 	 t 	

v 
gil.,•Wt:1-413,,ektrar  ) 	:IN-34N•b;;;,?..r.":4:4(e:Scri. Smith Bros. 

Chevrloet Co. 
Gorman Texas Phone 26 	Gorman, Texas We Also Have A LARGE SELECTION of Many Other PATTERNS 

AND COLORS To Choose From. 

While You're Up In The Air Over Our LOW PRICES - Listen To This - 

UNFINISHED HARDWOOD CHAIRS 
FINISH THEM TO MATCH YOUR OWN DECOR 

It Is Time To Replace Your 

STATE INSPECTION 
STICKERS 

SPECIAL - While They Last - 198 each 
(kirman tirogrrng 

IT WILL GIVE YOU A LIFT 

IF YOU PERK UP YOUR FLOORS WITH 

Entered as Second Class Moil at the Post 
Office in Gorman, Texas under the Act 
of March 3, 1878. Published on Thursday 
at Gorman, Eastland County, Texas. 

KERNEL EUGENE BAKER, OWiter-PitbliSititi 
JOE BENNETT, Assistant Publisher 

MIAs. CARROLL BICKLE, Editor-Office Mg' 
Herman Bennett, Apprentice NEW FLOOR TILE 

Vinyl or Linoleum 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Eastland, Comanche Counties 
$2.00 per year 

FLOORS SEE A LOT OF TRAFFIC - -

SO BE PREPARED! ! 

All other subscriptions, $3.00 per year 
Service Men, Complimentary 

Gilder's Texaco Service Station ADVERTISING RATES 
Display, per Column inch - 451 
National, less agency disc. - 56c 
Classified Advertising 	3c per word 

Minimum charge 50. DE LEON, TEXAS 
ASSICIATIII ESS  
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