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Rev Floyd Thrash Of 
Ft. Worth To Fill 
Methodist Pulpit 

VOLUNTEER FIREMEN 
HAVE THEIR DAY TODAY e 1-lEAR OLIN CULBERSON 

SECRETARY OF TFFMA 
RR COMMISSIONER 

FIRE CHIEF THOMPSON 
SAYS, "GORMAN HAS BEST 
IN FIGHTING APPARATUS" 

Volunteer Firemen.  siziing up 
the new fire truck on its arrival 
Friday agreed with Chief Quail 
Thompsori's, "Gorman now has 
the best in fire fightng appara-
tus." 

In a brief interview Thompson 
said, "The new 2 112 ton GMC 
coming to us at a cost of 9600 
dollars not only affords added 
protection it will cut down on 
the towns insurance rate even if 
we don't have to use it." 

The accompanying pump will 
throw 500 gallons per minute un-
der high pressure" 

The City's 23 
visiting firemen 

firemen 
from De 

with 
Leon 

time in getting out to 
a test of 
opacity. 

were not 

State Railroad Commissioner, 
Olin Culberson, will speak at the 
Firemen's Barbecue Thursday 
afternoon at Frank Gray Memori-
al Park. 

Culberson can be expected to 
bring an interesting and informa-
tional address. He has been Secre 
tary of the Firemen's and Fire 
Marshals' Association for the past 
33 years. 

He has been in public service 
almost continuously throughout 
his years of adulthood. 

A native of Hillsboro. He is the 
son of pioneers who were the 
first in bringing private schools 
to Texas, their school being 
known as the Culberson Select. 
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"BE AT THE BARBECUE" 
THIS MEANS YOU 
THURSDAY AFTERNOON 

lost no 
Frank Gray Park for 
the engine's energy 
Needless to say they 
disappointed. 

Two neighboring towns got a 
look at the attractive flame job 
when the boys visited them on 
Saturday. 

GORMAN - DE LEON CLASP 
HANDS ACROSS BORDER 

The new Methodist pastor for 
the Gorman Church, Rev Floyd 
Thrash, comes to Gorman from 
Fort Worth where he pastored 
the Asbury Methodist Church. 

Rev Thrash, Mrs Thrash and 
daughter, Judy, are due to arrive 
on Thursday. 

Highly favorable recommenda-
tions have come to the press and 
to the congregation from sever-
al sources, stating that Mr Thrash 
has been successful in former 
pastorates. 

Mr and Mrs Thrash pastored 
the Cross Plains Church a num-
ber of years ago when Mr and 
Mrs Mack Underwood lived in 
that town. Both Mr and Mrs Un-
derwood are pleased that they are 
to be in Gorman. 

Walter Underwood stated that 
Brother Thrash caught him and 
Mack fishing on Sunday. When 
asked if the preacher joined them 
Walter said, "We didn't ask him 
to." So of course Walter never 
did know whether Rev Thrash 
fishes on Sunday or not. 

However, we hear from other 
folks that the new pastor will be 
too busy with his church for Sun 
day outings. 

Mr and Mrs Thrash have two 
older daughters, both of whom 
are married. 

The newly reactivated Mauney-
Bryan American Legion Post No 

,594 elected their new officers 
last Friday and on Monday night 
met at the Fire Hall for instal-
latiOn. 

Visiting Legionaires from East-
land who installed and assisted 
were Commander Black, Pull-
man, Murphy, and Francis. 

Officers installed were . Post 
Corrunander Willie 0 (Bill) Parr, 
Vice-Commander Milton H Fair-
better, 2nd Vice-Commander. 
Calude Fuller, Post Adjutant Al-
vis Rodgers, Sergeant of Arms, 
Verlon Overstreet, Finance Of-
ficer, James Thompson, Historian, 
Arlton Smith, Chaplain, A V Lit-
tlefield, and Service Officer Arl-
ton Smith. 

Gus Frossard was appointed 
Child Welfare Chairman and 
Keith Whitt was appointed Judge 
Advocate. 

Post 594-  was organized follow-
ing World War 1 and was named 
in memory of Alvin Mauney who 
gave his life in a battlefield of 
France. It was later reactivated 
following World War II and its 
name was changed to Mauney -
Bryan Post No 594. 

The latter name honored the 
memory of Leland Bryan who 
died during the Pearl Harbor 
Attack. 

folks 
Fire- 
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Woodrow Browning 
Kenneth Watson 
Receive Eagle Awards 

Mutual interests draw 
close together. Volunteer 

O 

Plans For Festival 

Near Completion across 
County 

By 
Kernel Gene, aPe 

Mr and Mrs Jake Skiles assist-
ed by their granddaughter, Sha-
ron Allen, are now managing the 
swimming pool at Frank A Gray 
Memorial Park. Sharon is com-
pletely sold on the job and tries 

• to help, all the children who go 
swimming have a good time. 

0 
W L Wallace who is truck far- 

ming on Boyd Hilley's place has *anted several thousand sweet 
otato plants. He says he will 

have some spare time next week 
and will cut the grass and weeds 
around the lake. The Quarter-
back Club hopes to be in a posi-
tion to do some landscaping soon 
Plans pre also being made to e-
rect rest room facilities. 

• 
The big fellow roaming around 

the swimming pool Tuesday eve 
i nthe Japanese kimono was MI 
Sgt. T F Reese. The kimono is 
ordinary in Japan but somewhat 
of a curiosity here. 

This unusually hot weather we 
are having leads me to believe 
the people south of the border 
ar super-intelligent by taking off 
i nthe afternoon fora siesta. 

0-0 

My Car and I 
Safe and Sane 

men of two towns, Gorman and 
De Leon, having mutual inter-
ests have clasped hands 
the Eastland - Comanche 
border. 

It is not widely known that 

Jessie James Boykin 
Dies At De Leon 

. Jessie James Boykin passed to 
his eternal reward at his home in 
De Leon at 11:20 P M on June 11, 
1953. He was born January 21, 
1389, "and was a son of J M Boy-
kin and Amandy Grubbs Boykin, 
and was 64 years, 4 months, and 
20 days of age at the time of his 
passing. 

He is survived by his wife. Mrs 
Ada Boykin, to whom he was mar 
ried to in 1911, in Comanche tb-
unty, and by three children, Bon-
nie Boykin, his son, of Dallas, 
Texas; and two daughters, Mrs 
Zera Buchanan ,of De Leon, and 
Mrs Zada Henson, of Rising Star, 
as well as thirteen grandchildren. 

Also surviving are thlee broth-
ers, S M Boykin of De I.eon, H 
E Boykin of Cisco, and J C Boy-
kin of West, as well as six sisters, 
Mmes Dora Tolbert, Agnes Ezell, 
Alice Kid, Eula Pound, Gerty 
Kirk, and Beulah Stephens, as 
well as niany other relatives and 
friends. 

He was baptized and joined the 
Baptist Church in 1910. 

Funeral services were conduct-
ed from the First Baptist Church 
in De Leon, on Saturday, June 13, 
1953, with Rev Willie Skaggs and 
Rev M L Welch officiating, fol-
lowed by interment in the De 
Leon Cemetery. 

Pallbearers were Charles Na-
bors, Clyde Nabors, Lee Nabors. 
Ancil Hill, Frederick G Harmon, 
and Ray Kinnard. 

Beautiful funeral music was 
furnished by a quartet composed 
of C L Mohon, Jr, Al Strasner, 
W A Morgan, and J C Helm, Jr, 
with Mrs C L Mohon, Sr at the 
organ. 	 • 

Arrangements were with Sharp 
Nabors Funeral Home, De Leon. 
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WOMAN'S STUDY CLUB 
TO SPONSOR FESTIVAL 
BATHING REVIEW 

Scouts winning the Eagle A-
ward at Camp Billy Gibbons and 
members of Troop 38 were Wood 
row Browning and Kenneth Wat-
son. 

These badges will be awarded 
at a later date at ceremonies in 
Gorman. These boys have been 
four years attaining this honor. 

The troop won twenty-eight 
merit badges of the 244-awarded. 

Troop 38 has won first place 
in the water carnival fo rthree 
years consecutively. They have 
also rated Class A Campers for 
the three years. 
	O 

Scouts Win Honors 
At Camp Gibbons 

"Be at the Barbecue. If you 
don't you'll be sorry." 

First, because the dollar for the 
ticket will help buy fire-fighting 
clothing for Gorman volunteer 
firemen - - coats, hats and boots. 

And all the fellows are hoping 
that there will be enough over 
and above to buy a respirator. 
Now that would be something for 
these machines are owned by a 
limited number of fire depart-
ments. They are lifesavers. you 
know. 

The town will be closed on 
Thursday afternoon so if you hay 
en't bought yours, let's buy for 
the whole family. 

Make your dollar count. Let's 
give the Fire Boys a break. 

Second, because your dollar 
will pay for a big dinner. 

Third, because you will hear 
the State Railroad_ Commissioner. 

Fouth, because everyone will 
have a good time. 

PAT MORRISON IS CHOICE 
OF QUARTERBACKS FOR 
INDIAN TRAIL PRINCESS 

De Leon firemen have on differ-
end occasions rushed to the aid 
of local boys. Quoting one local 
boy, "They don't have to be ask-
ed. Just let them hear of a fire 
and they're on their way." 

City Secretary Rodgers remark 
ing on the friendly cooperation 
said, "Honestly they are as proud 
for us - - Well if they could be 
as proud as we are." 

Chief Richard Bond, Orville 
Setzler, and Ralph Terrell were 
among the De Leon Boys on the 
initial run. 

—0— 

Baseball Round-up 
By Alvis Rodgers 

MOTORIST' PRAYER 
Oh Lord! 
Grant me ,a steady hand, and 

watchful eye 
That no man shall be hurt 

when I pass by. 
Thou gayest life, and pray no 

act of mine 
May take away or mar that 

gift of Thine. 
Shelter those, Dear Lord, who 

bear me company 
From the evils of fire and all 

calamity. 
Teach me to use my car for 

others' need 
Nor miss through love of speed. 
The beauty of Thy world! That 

thus 
I may with joy and courtesy 

go my way. 
By courtesy of I 0 0 F. 

0 	 

PRETTY LOUISE SCITERN 
IS PROGRESSIVES CHOICE 
FOR QUEEN CANDIDATE 

The Woman's Study Club will 
sponsor the Bathing Review that 
will be hel Friday, July 17 at 
Brogdon Field in Gorman. 

There will be three age groups. 
First age group, 2 years through 
5 years. Second age group: Must 
be six years old or above but not 
having reached 12th birthday. 

Third age group: Must be 12 
years or above. To include gentle 
men 

Both boys and girls are invit-
ed to enter. 

Loving cups are to be awarded 
to the winner in each group. 

Out-of-town impartial judges 
will be present. 

Mothers who will enter their 
young fry, boys or girls, please 
contact Mrs Berenice Jeffs, Mrs 
Gus Frossard or Mrs Dorothy 
Hatcher. 

Neighboring towns will be ask 
ed to send entries 

0 	 
A TRIBUTE TO J L RAY 

Dennis - Kinser Vows 
Read In Church 

Ceremony 

Miss Ruby Lee Dennis, daught-
er of Mr and Mrs Marion Dennis, 
became the bride of James M 
Kinser, son of Mr and Mrs R L 
Kinser, at twlight Friday in a 
ceremony performed at the Mid 
way Baptist Church. Rev Gordon 
Bays, pastor of the First Baptist 
Church of Meridian, read the 
double ring ceremony. 

Rev J B Fowler sang "I Love 
You Truly" and "Always"; ac- 
companied by Mrs Fowler at the 
piano. Miss Margie Quarles, daint 
ily attired in pink sheer and wear 
ing a wristlet of white carnations 
assisted Doyle Lynn Clark in 
lighting the tapers. Haard Will- 
iams of Dumas, Army buddy of 
the groom, was best man and 
Howard Hagood and Doyle Lynn 
Clark ushers. 

'The bride was attended by her 
sister, Miss Mary Ruth Bennis, as 
maid of honor. She wore a baller- 
ina length frock of yellow or-
gandy over taffeta, designed with 
a strapless bodice and a nylon 
net stole attached. Her half hat 
was of yellow and white organdy, 
her mitts white nylon and she 
wore a corsage of white carna-
tions and stock. 

For the exchange of vows, the 
young couple stood beneath an 
arch of greenery and fern, flank-
ed by tall baskets of yellow glad-
iolus and carnations and yellow 
cathedral tapers in candleabi'a. 

The bride, given in marriage by 
her father, was lovely in white 
lace and nylon tulle, ballerina 
length: Her gown was designed 
with a lace bodice, cap sleeves, 
and a Peter Pan collar. The bouf-
fant tulle skirt was inset with 
lace panels and she wore match-
ing mitts of lace. Her finger tip 
veil was of nylon illusion, edged 
with lace and was attached to a 
Dutch type cap of wInte taffeta 
embroidered with pearls. She car 
ried a bouquet of yellow roses, 
entwined with• satin loops and 
ribbon. 

A reception followed the cere-
mony in the Church dining room. 
The handsomely appointed re-
freshment table, laid with lace 
over 'yellow, was centered with 
the three tiered wedding cake 
surroundd by an arrangement of 
white stock and fern. Yellow tap 
ers in crystal holders completed 
the table decorations. 

Mrs J E Lawrence and Mrs Bill 
Simpson persided at the punch 
bowls and Mrs Burnett Eison ser 
ved the cake. Names were secur-
ed for the bride's book by Mrs 
Roy Dennis. 

Mrs Kinser is a graduate of 
Gorman High School and for the 
past two years has been employ-
ed as Secretary at the High 
School. 

The groom is also a Gorman 
High graduate and for the past 
two years has served with the 
U S Army, having received his 
discharge in March. 

The young couple left on a 
short wedding trip to points in 
South Texas after which they 
will establish residence in' Gor-
man. For the travel the bride 
wore a lilac linen tailored dress 
with white accessories and a cor 
sage of yellow orchids. 

Patricia Morrison (Pat to you) 
has been selected by the Quarter 
backs as their candidate for the 
Queen of the Indian Trail Festi-
val. 

If Pat wins the honor she will 
be capable of reigning with grace, 
having had the previous honor in 
October 1952 of reigning as Hal-
loween Queen. 

A member of the Panther Spir-
it Staff for the 1953 edition and 
at present employed at Mehaffey 
Drug, Pat has a most attracive 
personality. 

To make it plain "Beauty is 
only one of Pat's talents - or is 
beauty one of the talents?" 

Speck Clark says this is the 
Quarterbacks year to win. 
MARY BETH WATSON 
VISITS IN DALLAS 

Mary Beth Watson is visiting 
in Dallas with Sylvia Enloe. She 
is considering employment in that 
city. 

Sylvia is doing clerical work 
with the Oliver Company. 

The Progressive Club began 
early boosting their candidate. 
They had a bake sale on Saturday 
at Ormsby Clover Farm Store us 
ing the proceeds for a nest egg. 

They are confident that Louise 
Scitern, their choice, is a winner. 
Rating a place in the School An-
nual as the MOST BEAUTIFUL 
GIRL Louise also carried off the 

itf ors of Valedictorian of the 
3 Graduating Class. 

Supporting her school in sports 
she was a member of the Pep 
Squad for four years. In 1952 she 
took 2nd place in the District 
Interscholastic Meet. 

The early bird gets the worm. 
The Progressives are expecting 
the early candidate to win the 
crown. 

KING THEATRE 
THURSDAY - FRIDAY 

John Hodiak - Maria Marques 
In 

AMBUSH AT TOMAHAWK GAP 
Also 

Sport Reel 

otatanuiewaiiiitglot7 SATURDAY 
Rocky Lane - Eddie Waller 

In 
BLACK HILLS AMBUSH 

And 
George Brent - Audry Totter 

In 
F B I GIRL 

Also 
Color Cartoon 

Is it too much to say that the 
Lord with him walked this way? 
No this is not too much to say 
of Rev J L Ray. 

It is the Blessed Presence ever 
beside Brother Ray that has so 
endeared him to his church folk, 
to the town folk, to the shut-ins, 
to many non-church folk. 

What a great and inspiring 
privilege it has been during his 
three years pastorate to know a 
man who walks so proudly yet 
with so much humility in the 
path of service he hits chosen. 

It is a joy that would justify 
the Psalmist praise, that of wit-
nessing Christian Living with no 
inconsistency in practice. 

His ever-increasing faith leaves 
for him no time for thoughts un-
worthy a minister. 

Much of his service and that 
of his wife may go unhearald but 
those who love him know that the 
Lord with him walked this way. 

LF 
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APOLOGY TO 0 E S 
AND WORTHY PATRON 

SUNDAY - MONDAY 
Fred MacMurray - Vera Ralston 

In 
FAIR WINDS TO JAVA 

Also 
Color Cartoon 
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Committees from the Woman's 
Study Club, Excelsior Clt1b, the 
Quarterback Club. and individ-
uals met at the High School Mon-
day night and made plans for the 
"1953 Indian Trail Festival", July 
16, 17, and 18. ,The Fire Depart-
ment will sponsor the Grande 
Parade which will be at 5:00 P M 
and will originate at the school 
asusual. Three prizes will be a-
warded for beauty, originality, 
and appropriateness. 1st prize is 
$25, second prize $15, and third 
prize $10. 

Later Thursday the 16th the 
coronation of the Festival Queen 
will be held. This event is spon-
sored by the Excelsior Club and 
will be held - in the High School 
Auditorium. 

Following the Coronation there 
will be a program by the children 
of the Odd Fellow Lodge. More 
about this program will be pub-
lished at a later date. 

On the second day of the Fes-
tival there will be a Pet Parade 
sponsored by Mrs Hubert Crad-
dock and Mrs Floyd Eison. Time 
for the Pet Parade will be 6:00 
P M. This has become an out-
standing event of the Festival 
and all kids are urged t.: see the 
above mentioned ladies to enter 
their pets this year as soon as 
possible. 

At 8:00 P M the Bathing Beau-
ty Revue sponsored by the Wo-
an's Study Club will be held in 
Brogdon Field in- conjunction 
with a musical program which 
will be announced by the Enter-
tainment Committee. 

Saturday, the last day of the 
Festival, the plans are for a big 
musical jamboree at Brogdon 
Field. The exact program is not 
known at this time. 

Each club in town is requested 
to select their contestant for the 
Queen's race and have their pic-
ture and containers in their re-
spective business places by the 
morning of June 22 and the con-
test will close Saturday night at 
9:00 P M, July 11. The Progres-
sive Study Club will be in charge 
of the counting of votes in the 
Queen's Race. 

Representing the Woman's 
Study Club were, Mrs Berenice 
Jeffs, Mrs Gus Frossard, and Mrs 
Dorothy Hatcher, and Miss Ozel-
la Pulley, T'ne Excelsior Club, Mrs 
Gene Baker, The Progressive 
Study Club, Mrs Floyd Eison, 
The Quarterbacks, Ross Wilson, 
Oda Monroe, Speck Clark, and 
Speedy Clark, and other individ 
uals, Mrs Hubert Craddock and 
Mrs Oda Monroe. 
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ANNOUNCEMENTS 

Playing at Stephenville Mil-
ton Fairbetter 104: Frank Rhy-
mes 100 and Wade Russell 114. 

Alex Phillips playing on an 
Austin course said we would 
have to take his word for the 41 
he shot - we havp no cause to 
doubt his veracity, except he is 
a Gorman Golfer. 

Stephenville has not sent infor 
mation as to their coining Tour-
nament. 

Speck Clark, Torn Fred Reese, 
Frank . Rhymes and Milton Fair-
better played at Ranger Wednes-
day. What, no score card! 

TUESDAY - WEDNESDAY 
Robert Ryan - Mala Powers 

In 
City Beneath the Sea 

Also 
Color Cartoon 

Friday night of last week the 
Ponys journeyed to Comanche 
and defeated' the Clay Lumber 
Jacks 22 0. This beiing the first 
shut out of the season. From all 
reports no player on the team 
could do no wrong and from the 
indication of the score someone 
was hitting the ball. Reynolds, 
the catcher, hit 3 for 4 leading 
in hits for the night. 

Monday night of this week the 
Little Leaguers were again de-
feated by th Ballow Insurance of 
Stephenville 18-3 while the Ponys 
defeated Summers Mattress from 
there by a score of 4 to 3. This 
was a jam up good ball game 
from start to finish. The ball 
game was 3 to 2 Summers until 
the top half of the 6th inning. 
James Morris came to bat and hit 
one deep into left field for a home 
run with one man aboard for the 
winning runs. Woodrow Brown-
ing also got a homer earlier in 
the game. Browning pitched five 
innings giving up 4 hits while 
Johnnie Rodgers gave up no hits 
in two innings. 

There will be a double header 
Thursday night. Little Leaguers 
playing Chev Motor from Ste-
phenville and Ponys playing an-
other team from there. 

Saturday night the Ponys play 
a strong team from Abilene This 
promises to be a real game. 

Monday night, June 22 a teen-
age team from here will play an 
all-colored team from Brown-
wood. The Little Leaguers will 
play a colored Little League team 
from Brownwood the same night. 

—0— 
ERNESTINE TODD VISITS 
IN GROVETON 

Ernestine Todd is visiting in 
Groveton this week with her aunt 
and uncle, Mr and Mrs Ben De 
La Foss. 

Mr and Mrs E E Todd, Mr and 
Mrs J R Todd, Mr and Mrs D 0 
Munn and ene Munn, and Ernes-
tine Todd went to Fort Worth on 
Sunday where they met Mr and 
Mrs De La Foss. 

Each family carried a picnic 
lunch to Forest Park where they 
enjoyed the day. 

•••••••••••••••••••••M•••••••••........W."•••••••••......ma.• rlo.".0••••••••• 

We regret that the name of 
Earney Todd, Worthy Patron of 
the Order of Eastern Star, who 
v.-as installed on Tuesday night, 
June 2, failed to appear in the 
names of officers listed in the 
item, GORMAN CHAPTER HAS 
INSTALLATION, in the June 11 
edition of the Gorman Progress. 
• This error was due to the edi-

tor's lack of familiarity with the 
Order of the Eastern Star. 

L F 

Watermelon Growers will meet 
Friday night, June 19th in the 
Agricultural Building at the Gor-
man School. 

Attending the Boy Scout Camp 
at Camp Billy Gibbons during the 
past week were: Kenneth Wat-
son, Woodrow Browning, Eddie 
Browning, Royce Dean Clement, 
Troy Underwood, Butch Eison, 
Johnny Watson, Larry Poynor, 
Jerry Yates, Jerry Warren, Divid 
Revels, Stanley Bell, Jimmy Bry 
ant, Roscoe Reeves, and Scout-
master Jack Deavenport. 

Troup 38 won first place in the 
swimming carnival. In the float-
ing contest Butch Eison took 
first, Bell second. In the boat bail 
ing contest the troup won third 
with Clement, Watson, W Brown 
ing and Bell. In the breast stroke 
Junior Eddie Browning won first 
place.. In breast stroke Senior 
Woodrow Browning took third 
place. 

In the Egg and Spoon Race Jr 
Jerry Yates won first. In the Sr 
Egg and Spoon Race Kenneth 
Watson won third place. 

In 200 yard relay Senior Wood-
row Browning, Kenneth Watson, 
Troy Underwood, and Royce 
Dean Clement competed. 

In the 100 yard relay Troop 38 
won first with Eddie Browning 
Jerry Yates, Jdhnny Watson, Jer-
ry Warren competing. 

In the Bathing Beauty Contest 
Larry Poynor won second place. 

Junior Sidestroke Eddie Brown 
ing won first place. 

Senior sidestroke Woodrow 
Browning won second place. 

The troop won a total of 37 
points to its credit. 

Heventeen troops were repre-
sented at the camp. They were 
two from Stephenville, Ranger, 
Breckenridge, Cisco and three 
from Brownwood. one from Ris-
ing Star, Richland Springs, Gor-
man Goldthwaite, San Saba, and 
Brooksmith. 

The Gorman Scouts returned 
about five o'clock on Sunday af-
ternoon. 

In handicraft Gorman won first 
and second with Butch Eisen and 
David Revels. 

They won third place in Stunt 
Night. 

They were Class A Campers. 

Melba Brown is visiting in Sea-
graves. 

Methodist Pastor 
Goes To Corsicana 
Rev and Mrs J L Ray returned 

from Fort Worth Monday morn-
ing bringing their appointment to 
Central Church in Corsicana. 
They 'were accompanied by their 
daughter, Mrs Paul Luker, and 
her son, David of Houston, and 
the Ray's grandson, Jerome Ray, 
Jr, of Fort Worth. Mrs Luker will 
assist her parents in moving and 
will accompany them to Corsica-
na for a brief stay. Mr Luker is 
in Pittsburg, Penn on a business 
trip. 

District Superintendent Leslie 
Seymour, who agreed for Rev 
Ray to be transferred out of the 
Cisco District, stated, to Brother 
Ray that the Corsicana Church 
has a new building and that there 
are great possibilities for increas 
ed Christian service. The salary 
is understood to be on par with 
the maximum Gorman church 
salary. 

Hubert Craddock, former Chair 
man of the Board of Stewards, 
had stated at the last Quarterly 
Conference of the local church 
held by Rev Seymour that the 
church would be pleased to have 
Brother Ray return for a fourth 
year. 

Don't forget the Homecoming 
and All Day Singing at Kokomo. 
Dinner on ground June 27th. 

THURSDAY — FRIDAY 
John. Derek - Mona Freeman 

In 
THUDERBIRDS 

Also 
Disney Cartoon 
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WITH OUR BOYS 
ATTEND GLEN ROSE CAMP 
JUNIOR LIVE WIRES ILLNESS In GORMAN OLIVER SPRINGS 

NEWS 
Reporter, Mrs. C. E. Atchison 
Guests of Mr and Mrs Herman 

Hardin last week were her broth 
er, Bobby Ray Eads, and family 
frcm Phillips, Texas and her sis-
ter, Mrs T P Cavitt, and family 
of De Leon. 

Mr and Mrs Lee Skaggs and 
children are still on vacation and 
visiting with her parents, the J E 
Daniels, at this writing. 

Mr and Mrs Alvis Scitern and 
children of New Hope were Sun 
day guests of the Daniels. 

Billy Hunton visited with the 
Sciterns last week. 

Mr and Mrs Melvin Daniels 
and son, Mr and Mrs Warren 
Johnston and children, the Clif-
ford Moores and the Jack Adcock 
family went for a picnic at Frank 
A Gray Memorial Park Sunday. 

Mr and Mrs Grover Perry visit 
ed with Mr and Mrs Roland Per-
ry on Sunday, June 17. 

Harvey Parker of Gorman was 
in this community on business 
Monday. (Our apoligies to you, 
Harvey, for forgetting to mention 
the fact that it was your birth- I 
day). 

Mr and Mrs Jessie Atchison.' 
Mrs Roy Parker, and Mrs Dewey: 
Lindley visited Sunday afternoon! 
in Goldthwaite with Mr and Mrs! 
Irby Mauney and Mrs Anna Atchi 

EN THE SERVICE 
Mrs 0 D Bibby is able to be 

driving around. 
Mrs Marviin Blair has return-

ed to her home. She is doing 
nicely. 

Mrs Vernon Brown is able to 
get about the house on crutches.. 
Recently she fell and injured her 
knee. 

Ann Kirk is recovering from 
the measles. 

Mrs J R Barron continues to be 
a patient at Blackwell Hospital. 

L E Sharp, Rt 3, Gorman„ is 
also a patient at this writing on 
Tuesday. 

Mr G 0 Boyd has been a pa-
tient at Blackwells during the 
past week. He has suffered a vir-
us infection which has effected 
his back. He was reported as im-
proved on Tuesday. 

Mr Will Capers continues to be 
critically ill. He is at his home. 

Mr Walter Underwood has been 
feeling better during the past • 
week. 

Mrs Porter, mother of Mrs Hel-
en Claxton, is able to be up and 
around her home. Her injured 
limb is apparently healing nicely. 

We are dubbing the Junior 
Girls, who got off to camp at 
Glen Rose on Monday morning, 
"Live Wires." We figure that 
each of the 150 Juniors at camp 
will know that the Gorman Jun-
iors are "Live Wires" before the 
week is gone. 

There are parnts who are anxi-
ous to be rid of their children 
for awhile but the "Live Wires" 
were really anxious to be rid of 
their parents when they reached 
camp early Monday. So the "Main 
mas" had to come right back 
home, each hoping that their first 
time campers would make it ok. 

The "Live Wires" are Pat Deav-
enport, Judy Mehaffey, Tomasine 
Whitt, and Gerry Haile. 

They were accompanied to 
camp by Mrs Haile, Mrs Deaven-
part, Mrs Mehaffey, Joe Mehaf-
fey, and Mary Del Thompson. 

J 0 Jackson Jr of San Diego, 
Calif is now Petty Officer 31c. He 
is attending school and we hear 
that he and Gaynelle read every 
line of the paper. That makes us 
paper folks feel good. 

Agriculture 

Chemicals 

O ARE YOU HAVING 

BUG TROUBLE? 
Gary Rhymes likes Biloxi, Miss 

issippi. Who wouldn't Gary? Pop 
ular magazines tell us that you 
are at the beginning of the 
world's most beautiful coastal 
beach. We will agree for we trav-
eled along the coast from Pont 
Chartrain to Panama City Beach 
in Florida. The scene and the ad-
venture is something to remem-
ber. 

Doug Rhymes, who is stationed 
in Japan, should be writing Mam-
ma and Papa Rhymes for they 
are getting anxious to hear. 

2 Cents per word - MINIMUM 
Charge 50 cents. See us for insecticides that 

will protect your crops. 

We know they are good! Do you have enough Fire Insur 
ance? Let me save you money. 

I C. J. Thompson, Box 69, Phone 
590, Comanche, Texas. State 
Farm Insurance Companies. 

•••••••/W•0•••••WV•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••/1/4.4w,•••• ••  

"NOTICE - We do first class reno-
vating on mattresses. We make 
new cotton and innerspring mat-
tresses. Pritchard Mattress Fac-
tory. ?Phone 3731 - Night 3841, 
DeLeon, Texas. We pick up and 
deliver. 	 fn 

Have you ordered your - 

ARMOUR'S 

BIG CROP 

FERTILIZER 
M1Sgt Tom Reese, Mrs Reese, 

and family arrived on Tuesday 
from Japan via the Pacific Coast 
to visit his mother, Mrs Eugene 
Baker, and Mr Baker. 

Do you have water problems? 
If you have bring the m to us. 
We have Pumps (All Kinds) 
Pipe, Water Heaters and Irriga-
tion Systems. Gorman Machine 
Shop - Your Mssey-Harris Deal- 
er. 	 9-11-fn 

GORMAN PROGRESS 
Published on Thursday at Gorman 

Eastland County, Texas 
Entered as Second Class ,Mail. at the 
Postoffice In Gorman, Texas, under 
the Act of March 3. 1879. 

Card Of Thanks 	50 cents 
ADVERTISING RATES 

35c Per Column Inch 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

Local, Trade Territory — 1 	50 Yr 
Six months or less 	 
Out of Trade Territory .... $2514:10  1., 

EUGENE (Gene) BAKER 
Owner-Publisher 

LUCRETIA FAIRBETTER, Editor 
JOE BENNETT, Shop Foreman 

,!..49-004/Men440-00000•4 
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D. J. Jobe & Son New Orleans (FHTNC) —
Among 138 Eighth Naval District 
Reservists from five states who 
departed here for a two-week 
training cruise in the Caribbean 
is Dewey R Brogdon, seaman ap-
prentice, USNR, son of Mrs Mar 
cella Brogdon of Gorman. 

Tne reservists, aboard the pa-
trol craft escorts 842, 846, and 870, 
will visit Cienfuegos, Cuba, for 
a weekend of liberty and recrea-
tion. 

Upon completion of their re-
fresher shipboard training, they 
will return to New Orleans June 

0 DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE e 
— Hamilton Rendering Co. — 
Free and Sure — Call Collect 

?hone 303, Hamilton, Texas 	fn 

The baby of Mr and Mrs G B 
Hooper underwent a major opera 

• tion at Harris HOspital in Fort 
Worth. The baby is reported to 
be recovering. 

Mrs Hooper is the former Ar-
lene Fuller. 

Phone X-2 German • Farm Mach:nery and Supplies 

FOR DOZER WORK see SCHU- 
MAN and VANCE, De Leon. Tex 
as. Brush Pushing, Tanks and 
Sub-Soil Plowing. 	12-18fn 

son. 
Mr and Mrs W B Day were hap 

py to have some of their children 
from West Texas visiting with 
them over the week end. 

Our children having left early 
Sunday afternoon we decided to 
call on some of the neighbors. 
Among those whom we visited 
were Mrs Sam Tunnell and Mrs 

Singer Sewing Machine Co. 
Singer Consoles as low as $121.00 
Singer Portables as low as $92.50 
Good used Machines $15 and up. 
Call or write for Free Demon-
stration. 115 So. Lamar, Phone 
863, Eastland, Texas. 	fn 

GLASSES 

Correctly Fitted 

Economically Priced 

• 

Molly Sanders whose health does 19th for release to inactive duty. 	 • 
not permit them to get out very • 	 -- 	 0 
often. They seemed so glad to see Joe Mauney is stationed At Fort 
us that it made me feel ashamed Bliss, El Paso. He left Tarleton 	Dr. Geo. Blackwell  • 
of not visiting them more often. College at the close of the last I Blackwell Sanitarium 

0 

Mr and Mrs Hugh Bailey visit semester. 
ed in Brownwood Sunday with 	 -0— 

If you are sick see your doctor. 
If your watch is sick see Elbert 
Denton. 	 fn 

WHY BUY A NEW RADIO? —
We can fix your old one. Written 
Guarantee on every job. Kay 
Radio & Television, De Leon, 
Texas. 	 4-2fn 

Most of the time, Pop just gets the 
bills and the headaches. That's why 
your Clover Farm store is scheduling 
these wonderful double feature buys 
cn dozens of top-quality items. We'd ; 
like to see a smile on Pop's lace at 
leas once a year: 

• 
0 

Hugh's mother. 	 CHANGE IN BOX RENT 	
I  

Gorman 	Texas t 

Relatives from Mercedes, Texas RATES ANNOUNCED 	F*0•00****** ***0•000-41••••4 
arrived at the Bailey home the 	There will be a change in local! 
first of the week. They are Mr Postoffice boxes beginning July 1, 
Bailey's brothers, Walter, who is 1953. Small boxes renting now 

completion of well. W B Norton, still with them at the present for 60 cents will be 90 cents. 
Phone 9520, Cisco, Texas 	G-25p time, and Mr and Mrs Bill Bailey, 

CLOVER
Rigi MIX ___ 2 P9kgs 

Oz.
. Li 

0190 MUSTARD 	I6-Ja
r 

WANTED — Water Wells to drill 
for irrigation of home use. Terms 
arranged for 3 year payment on NOTICE TO FARMERS 

Our supply of PABAK 5-10-5 
is exhausted. However, we will 
sell HEART OF TEXAS at the 
same price as PABAK as long 
as this supply lasts. 

We still have a large supply of 
good fertilizers which we guar-
antee to put out. 

To save money, see us before 
you buy. 

Farm — All Vegetable Shortening 	FRESH WAPCO  Clover 

790 BLACKEYED PEAS 2 1%1°i-7113r:0 29'  

SUGAR IMPERI L 2 BoNes 25° 
1-Lb. 

SHORTENING _____ 3 Ian Larger boxes renting for 75 
who have gone on to Iowa. 

James Brown visited his par-
ents im Sunday. Corky Brown, 
who has been visiting in San Mar 
cos, returned with him. 

Brown is in the Guards. He 
will train at Fort Hood beginning 
June 28th. If he is not called into 
service he will return to Gorman 
for a brief stay before accepting 
employment. 

cents will be $1.10. 
Larger boxes renting for $1.00 

will be $1.50. 
The basic schedule now in ef-

fect has not been' changed since 
1907 and the increased charges 
are made to conform with increas 
ed cost of providing the equip-
ment and maintaining the serv-
ice. It is believed that patrons 
generally will recognize that this 
is a proper step. 

FOR SALE — 38 head Angora 
Goats - nannys and kids. Bruce 
Laminack. 	 6-18p 

GLENDALE 

TUNA FISH r 's. 	Can / 2 	 29' WHITE SWAN — CREAM Frank Holland 
Automatic Saw Grinding 

Lawn Mower Grinding 
Dial 4581, De Leon, 	5-30fn 

25" MARSHMALLOW 
TEA LIPTON'S 

29' 

27' 
29° 
19* 

RANCH 
STYLE _____2 No. 300 

Cans BEANS 	 Pint 

CLOVER FARM GORMAN PEANUT COMPANY 
Gorman, Texas 

NOTICE — The Lakeside proper 
ty of Dr D 	Rodgers is legally 
posted againST trespassers. 6-llc 

FOR SALE — One 3 112 room 
house located on Cresent Street 
West of Brogdon Field. Contact 
City Secretary. 

Signed: City Comission 

1/4 -Lb. 

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE _,Can LIPTON'S 
TEA BAGS 	 16-Count 

LEMON JUICE :ArINALEY 6-0z. Bottle 

BLACKBERRIES 	
No. 2 

Can 

STEM and PIECES 

MUSHROOMS 	2-0z. 
Can 

BEETS "'""
No. 303 

Slioed 	  Can 

Vic PETER PAN 

25 
PEANUT BUTTER 

WE HAVE BEEN ABLE TO SECURE SOME GOOD QUALITY PEANUT SEED 
GROWN IN OKLAHOMA AND SHELLED BY SWIFT & CO., DURANT, OKLA. 

12-Oz. 35' 
17* 
15° 
23° 
17' 

Glass 

DIAMOND TOWELS 
FOR SALE — Grocery and Mar-
ket. Best location in town. Box 
264, Boyd, Texas 	 7-2p 

FOR SALE — Fairbanks - Morse 
Electric pump with pipe: Also fat 
fryers for sale. C R Day. 

Roll 

19° 

BABO 	 
DIAMOND DILATES 9 12-inch 

Plates 
VENDOR'S STATEMENT OF ANALYSIS 
ANALYSIS SWIFT & CO. Durant, Ok. 
Kind: PEANUTS 
Lot No. 12 - Grown in Okla. 
Purity: 98:00% Inert 2.00c, 
Other Crop Seed: .00 	Weed Seed .ClOcc, 

2 Cans DEL MONTE 

CORN Cream Style 2  No. 303 
Milt° 	  Cans 39°  SKINNER'S :=N 	10-

Box Dr. Fehrman H. Lund 
OPTOMETRIST 

Eye Examinations — 
Prescribing of Lenses 

— Visual Rehabilitation 
Phone 30 405-6 Exchange B 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 
rere 

Weed Seed: 00% 
Noxious Weed Seed: None 

Germination 92c 
Tested 3-27-53 Wgt. 100 lbs. 
By: Okla. Dept. of Agriculture 

HOME FOLK 
SUNSHINE CHOCOLATE CRUNCH 

2r COOKIES 	10-0z. 
Bag 39° 

CRACKERS KRISPY 	Box 
SUNSHINE  27' 

39' COOKIES 

BUTTER BEANS 2 'di: 
WHITE SWAN — SHOESTRING 

	2  2 IA -Oz. 
Cans POTATOES 

OLIVES Queen 	
No. 16 

Jar 
SUNSHINE 10-Oz. 27° BUTTER 	 Ctn. 

47*. : 
. 	• 	. 	• .?.rit 	• b .': 	• 

.".• • at • 

e GOOD QUALITY SEED MAY BE HARD TO FIND AND IT MIGHT 
BE WISE TO BUY NOW. 	c=fiUM111=11•11=1 

17' I 

MORTON HOUSE 

Brown Gravy & Beef 	PUREX 
LIGHT CRUST 

FLOUR 

10 

1 4, ot 

J. E. WALKER 
Druggist 

Phones 
55 	Nite 109 

1-Lb. 57e  
Can BLabg.  89 SALE 	 SALE 

Fertilizer Prices Reduced 

We have sold all machinery out of our fertilizer plant, 

Quart 
rT 

A 

ti 

:.Iehaffey 
Drug 

POUND 

HAMBURGER MEAT 35c 
POUND 

22c 
.• • 

OLEO, Clover Farm 

BONELESS 

STEW MEAT 
3 LB. CAN 

80c 
• 

.0 • 

41. 	...... 	 • • 

4 • • 	 •• • 	• 	• 	 • • • 4 

4,• 	• 1:11 4.1•••• • 	 • I le 41.  • 

• s'  • •-• 	• 	• • • • •• • 

49c 	SPRY In order to move all the fertilizer 
we are reducing prices to the following: 

ORANGE or LEMON 

FROZEN JUICE 
CAN 

15c 

3 LB. CTN. 

55c 

our money 
competitor's 
first in the 

CHUCK ROAST 39c PABAK 
$40.80 per ton 
42.00 per ton • 

to the consumer, f. o. b. 

COOL OFF AT 4-12-4 
5-10-5 
These pries are the cash prices 
our plant in Gorman, Texas. 

Mg Lake Cisco GOOD 7 or CHUCK 

STEAK 45c 	PURE LARD 

Swimming Pool 
, 

EVERY ITEM ADVERTISED IS GUARANTEED. To satisfy you, 
saving prices are our low prices. We don't have to wait to see cur 
prices to give you prices the market justifies. We always try to be 
Market Declines. 

ROLLER SKATING — 
MINIATURE GOLF 

— Free Picnic Grounds — 
Available in 80 or 100 pound cotton print bags at 52.00 per 
ton extra. 

sal 

I. 	 'se,  Fireworks July 4 O MAKE FATHER HAPPY BY SHOPPING THE CLOVER FARM WAY These prices are limited to our present supply. 
o. 

0.4 • r 
• -• 

SAME HIGH QUALITY 

GORMAN PEANUT COMPANY 
0 Your Account is appreciated 
lorman, Texas - the Oldest Bank 
n East' and County. 

A Good Bank To Bank With 

.11 

- S*-- • 

• 
PHONE 135 	 GORMAN, TEXAS Radio Repair Service and Radio 

Tubes. E. E. Todd. 	fn areWW.,0%,%••vaNd•.ese".."-see e0%."0".."0"..a.",•"•~Npese...0%•nete"eini 
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The Gorman Progress, Eastland County, Texas, Thursday, June 18, 1953 "The Paper Home Folk Prefer' We have the "GO" in Gorman — Let's make Gorman GO! 

I 
Underwood recently visited the 	All singers ate cordially invit- 

John Tuckers. 	 . 	i ed to the Cheaney Church of 

Mr and Mrs Lee Yancey ,and I Christ next Sunday afternoon at 
CHEANEY NEWS 
Reporter, Mrs. Bill Tucker 

DESDEMONA NEWS Mr and Mrs Roy Guthery. 	. ghter of Mr and Mrs Andrey Ma- 	 DUSTER 
Reporter, Mrs. Ethel Keith I Mr and Mrs Burl Griffith of rine of Strawn, spent the week 

2:30 P M for a Gospel singing. Betty Jean of Alameda went to 

	

Sunday church attendance at 	 I Come and bring others with you. Afton last week for a visit wiith 

	

both Baptist and Church of Christ 	 Mr and Mrs McGaha of Staff their daughter and sister, Mrs 

	

was very good. The Baptist pas- 	 visited their daughter and family, Eunice Mae Gregory, and fam- 

	

tor; Dixie Clement, filled his reg 	Mr and Mrs J B Blackwell, follow ily. Betty plans to stay 2 weeks  

	

ular second Sunday appointment, 	 ing church service, and help the Gregorys get moved' 
Those attending the Farm Bu- into Lubbock. 

I reau Meeting in Eastland Thurs-
Mr and Mrs Jack Rayfield, day night were The Jno Loves 

Paul and Ginny of Ranger, and • morning and eevning services, a• au 

BUFF end with her uncle and aunt, Mr ROCK L 	NEWS  
and Mrs Virgil Northcutt. 	Reporter, Mrs Ernest Johnson 

Mr and Mrs Hugh Abel are 
moving into their new home this Rock Bluff and Duster Baptist  
week. The house was moved in and Church of Christ all had good 

attendance, also some visitors. from Stephenville 	 . . . 
Mr lawnHenrySkaggs Mr and Mrs Jessie Sparkman with a large number of hearers. seriously ill with pneumonia and are spending their vacation in Bill Grashara of Abilene also was carried tothe De Leon Hos- Freer with their son, Mr and Mrs 	 preached to a large group at both pital for a few day. But we are 

and Loresta, The Ben Freemans, 
Homer Joe Sparkman 

the Church of Christ. With him 	 Mr and Mrs Thelbert Jones and 
Mrs Curtis Blackwell and Jackie I  

Mrs Buryl Scott and son of Oil and back home. We hope for him were Mrs Greshamd m 	d  visited the parental Herman Ner ' 
gers, Sunday. 

1 
Airs Chuck Williams, also from 

roud to report he is improved Mr and Mrs Robert Miears and 13  

Forsan visited the week end with 
his parents, Mr and Mrs Dave 
Griffith. 

Mrs Juanita Pilgrim visited in 
Dallas with her mother, Mrs Nina 
Lohman. 

Mr and Mrs Aaron Hensley of 
Lingleville were visitors Sunday 
afternoon with her parents. Mr 
and Mrs W H Davis 

The S W Walkers visited one 
night this week with her parents, 
Mr and Mrs Hugh Abel. 

Billie Paul Lewis of the U S 
Army was home for the week 
end. 

Mr and Mrs Bennie Northcutt 
of Rising Star were Monday night 
visitors in the Torn Northcutt 
home. 

Mrs Bill Greenhaw is a patient 
in a Ranger hospital. 

Little Miss Paula Marine, dau- 

• its reporter 

Lt and Mrs Bobbie Burleson 
are the proud parents of a baby 
boy born last week in the Dub-
lin hospital. Both mother and 
baby are doing fine. Mrs Burleson 
was able to come home to her 
parents, Mr and Mrs Lonnie Wil-
liamson. The baby is still in the 
incubator. 

Word was received here Sun-
day that Mr and Mrs Dave Grif-
fith have another granddaughter. 
She is the daughter of Mr and 
Mrs Royce Griffith of Kermit. 

Mr and Mrs 'Morgan Roberts 
and Brenda visited in Granbury 
the past week end with his par-
ents, the F K Roberts'. 

Mr and Mrs Pug Guthery and 
Karen of Kermit visited several 
days here this week with her mo-
ther, Ethel Kith. and his parents, 

speedy recovery Center, N M visited a few days 
Mr and Mrs Allen Grisham of this week with Mr and Mrs Ray Abilene. The two couples were 

d Joiner.Coleman visited Frank Skaggs. 
dinner guests of Mr and Mrs Ben 
Freeman 

Mr and Mrs jr Moore of Fort Mr and Mrs Seal Smith visited 
sister, Mr and Mrs Carl Worth visited the week end with . her 

his parents, Mr and Mrs Floyd; Roundtree in San Angelo, over 
Moore Sr, and her parents. Mr1 the wee kend. 
and Mrs Hyson Echols. 	I Mr and Mrs Lyndell Coan of 

	0 	 1 Waco visited relatives,  here Sun- 

Card
day. 

of Thanks 

Mrs Monroe Ainsworth was ill 
I 
• 

and unable to attend church ser  

vice Sunday morning. 
Mr and Mrs Oscar Strickler, 

Johnny Mac and Edward and Ver 
gil Blackwell spent the afternoon 
with Mrs J. P Strickler 

An old time friend, Miss Ann 1 
Jensen or Austin, visited Mrs CT 
C Freeman the pastwe'ek in the 
Ben Freeman home 

Paul and Dick Ormsby of Bor-
ger are spending their vacation 
with their parents, Mr and Mrs 
W J Ormsby. Mr and Mrs W B 
Ormsby of Dallas were week end 
visitors, and Mrs Elmer Stacy 
and son, Denny. 

Mrs Stacy and Dick Ormsby 
left Monday for College Station. 
where they will visit their sister, 
Mrs C K Esten, and family. 

Other church visitors present 
were Mr and Mrs Oscar Strickler 
and Johnny Mac of Ft Worth, Mr 
and Mrs McGaha from Staff, also 
Misses Anne and Sue Weekes of 
Comanche, and Mr and Mrs Fred 
Rogers and baby of Alameda, 
also Cicero Rogers, and Mr and 

,444.0-vt00410•04414,4-04-044-04•04-0.4.004....004.•004•4".004P411  

1  Mrs Berl Scott and son of An- 
- 	 I  chews visited, with Mr and Mrs 

May the Lord Bless each one George Scott and Mr and Mrs 
lormacsoe pens oes.o..0..smfranais neenonaeanafrosons afroenosesit of you who ministered unto us Abb Coan Sunday. 	 Mrs Herman Nerger. 

with such loving kindness during , Mr Johnnie Henderson of Gor A group of Cheaneyites, includ 
the period of our anxiety and man visited in the home of Mr ing Mr and Mrs Butler, Mr and 
grief at the illness and passing and Mrs Will Haynes. 	 Mrs Bud Blackwell, Mr and Mrs 

of our husband and father. 	 J B Blackwell; Mrs Belle Black-
Mr and Mrs Jack Ross and son 

Mrs Pearl Miles 	 well, and Mr and Mrs Hatley 
of Pecos visited in the home of ' I Dean, Bill Grasham and wife, 
Mr and Mrs N J Pounds and Chuck Williams and wife, arid the 

Ben Freemans, attended the Sun 
day afternoon singing at Gorman. 

Mr and Mrs Aurthur Love made 
an evening call in the Herman 

Why OnIy Half? 

Mr and Mrs Wayne Wells 
and Christine Wells. 

Many property owners careless-
ly gamble on an amount of fire 
Insurance which may hardly cov 
Er half the value of their prop-
erty. Wiser persons glay pay a 
few dollars more for complete in 
surance. Isn't it worth while to 
!mow you ore fully protected? 

--0— 
J T BOHANNONS 
MOVE TO CALIFORNIA 

other relatives a few days. 
Mr and Mrs Tommie Gray, Mr 

and Mrs Ernest Johnson, and Mr 
and Mrs Audie Whitehurst and' itmetetRea edaest 

Mrs J T Bohannon writes the 
, Gorman Progress from Phoenix, 
Arizona that she came to Gorman 
intending to attend the Hankins 

Shelley's Gifts Will Stand The Test 

Billfords — Lighters — Hankies 

Nylon Socks — Fountain Pens 

Stationery — Razor Sets — Ash Trays 

Jergen's Deodorant for Men 

SHELLEY VARIETY STORE 
T. 0- SHELLEY, Owner 

We Handle School Supplies 

Phone 28 
	 Gorman 

W.G. KIRK AV/AVS. 

s ; I : 
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Gorman. THE PLAmuT MARKETING CANTER or THE I.ORLDerer4S 

Ex-Students Reunion but that she with Mr and Mrs Tom Johnson 
and other members of her family and Mary Lou Sunday. 
became ill during their stay and Mr and Mrs George Scott, Mr 
she was unable to attend. 	and Mrs Fulton Smith and John- 

She also said that she and Mr nie Gray attended the funeral of 
Bohannon were moving to Cali- a relative in Ranger Sunday even 
fornia where they hoped Mr Bo- ing  
hannon would have better health. Mr and Mrs Wade Coon and 

• 
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4 
years it has been our 

4 
4 	

privilege to render a 

4 	 service to this corn- 

4 	 munity. 

4 

3' 
 

4 

— MONUMENT BUILDERS —a. 
Phone 24 	 Weatherford, Texat 

4 	Mrs. Dave Ramzey, Gorman Representative 

Geectiettettettetectsesetseetec 

BIRTHS parents. Mr and Mrs .Rye Coan, 
Saturday. 

Patsy Lea Owings born to Mr Mr and Mrs N J Pounds visited 
and Mrs Wesley Harding Owings I Mr and Mrs Rob Nabors in the 
of Moran on June 9th weighed 8, Pounds Community Sunday even 
pounds and 4 ounces. 

Walter Layne Maynard born to 
Mr and Mrs Walter Bascom May-
nard of Eastland on June 14 wei-
ghed 8 pounds and 8 112 ounces. 

ee
ee

ee
e e

ee
ee

ee
ee

ee
e  

For o v e r sixty-eight 

4)•••••••••41•41•44)44,400tea•-o6beme0400404)4.4}40Ao0664.404/414< 

and Mr and Mrs Lester Stanley 
and daughter. 

Mr and Mrs Frank Newlin and 
children visited her grandmoth-
er, Mrs Kerley, at Terrell, Okla 
homa a few days. 

Alex Rawlins & Sons 

Ever Thought of This ? 
.. If you buy real estate without an abstract the chances 
are good that you will be required to furnish one when 
you sell or borrow money. It is customary for seller io fur-
nish buyer with an abstract as he usually adds cost of 
same to the sale's price. So for many reasons all in your 
favor get an abstract and have it examined by your attor-
ney when you buy real estate. 

--.0— 
SEVERAL REMINDERS 
TO OUR PATRONS 

You may receive your house 
numbers at the Progress Office. 

, The summer reduced water' 
$$ rates are on. 

Front End 

Alignment 

Specialists 

KING MOTOR CO. 

Phone 42 	Eastland 

1 

1  

The post office box rent goes 
up July 1st. 

Don't forget to pay your sub-1  
scription if your subscription is 

$ scribers unpaid will be removed' 
1 from the mailing files on July 2. 

Earl Renner & Company 
due in May or June. May sub - I  

EASTLAND 	(Abstracting since 1923) 

girls attended church at Highland Nerger home at Alameda on Fri 
Sunday evening. Rev Ernest Rip- day. 
petoe is doing the preaching. The Nergers' hear regularly 

Mr and Mil Deryl Johnson and from their son, Charles, stationed 
daughters of Comanche visited at Munich, Germany. 

Cicero Rogers tells us that all 
his daughters, Gladys Bibby, Let-
ty Craddock, and Veda Burns, 
are visiting their brother, Roy, 
in California, but they plan on be 
ing home with him on Fathers 
Day, next Sunday. 

Jessie and Rita Underwood 
spent the past week with their 
grandparents, Mr and. Mrs Will 
Underwood, at Alameda. Mrs Eva 

ing. 
Mr and Mrs Dan Strather and 

children attended the Gregory 
Reunion at the Nabors Lake on 
Wednesday and Thursday. Rela-
tives were present from Califor-
nia, Ft Worth, Midland and San 
Angelo. 

Visitors in the home of J J 
Smith over the week end, were 
Mr and Mrs Bill Hamilton of 
Chilicothe, Mrs J C ,Harrison and 
twin boys of Ranger, Mrs M F 
Davis of Proctor, Miss Mary Gray 
es .of Cisco, Mr and Mrs W E Wil 
son, Mr and Mrs George Scott, 
Mrs Torn Bingham and family, 

There's only one answer... 

he 
must be 

STIR ETCH  N 
YOUR FOOD DOLLAR . . LIVE BETTER 

INIITE AN HOME FREEZER 

Fleet operators, farmers, independent truckers—truck users everywhere —

buy more Chevrolets than any other make. There can be only one reason 

Ask any of your friends who own an Electric Home 
Freezer and they will tell you they enjoy better 
eating for less money the year 'round. How do they 
do it? Here are four of the most typical reasons: 

• By taking advantage of special prices and food 
sales . . . storing food for future use when prices 
are lowest, quality highest. 

• Freezing surplus foods in season . . . fish, game, 
meats, vegetables, fruits. 

• Cooking and baking in quantities . . . foods keep 
perfectly till needed, require only heating before 
serving. 

• Cut food waste . . . fewer leftovers. Even these 
can be stored for future meals. 

for that: Chevrolet trucks offer more of what you want. 

I 

As the official registration figures keep roll-
ing in, they keep telling the same positive 
story about truck popularity and truck value: 
Again in 1953, for the twelfth straight pro- 

• 

important to you. Why? Well, as you know, 
trucks are built and bought for just one 
reason—to do a job. So isn't it logical then 
that since Chevrolet trucks outsell all others, 
they must do a better job at lower cost? 

That's why it will pay you to stop in and 
see us before you buy your next truck. 

"LIVE BETTER 
SAVE MONEY 

WITH AN ELECTRIC 
HOME FREEZER" 

duction year, truck buyers show a clear-cut 
and decisive preference for Chevrolet trucks. 

If you're a truck user, this fact is mighty 

See your favorite dealer for additional 
benefits of an Electric Home Freezer. 
Select a chest type or space-saving up-
right model to suit your needs. MORE CHEVROLET TRUCKS IN USE THAN ANY OTHER MAKE! 

• 

SMITH - BROS. CHEVROLET CO. 
TEXAS ELECTRIC SERVICE COMPANY 

L. D. STEWART, Manager PHONE 26 GORMAN 



You can mail a check without 
fear of loss. Ii doesn't become 
money until received, endorsed 
and deposited by the one for 
whom it's intended. Your can-
celled check then becomes a 
bona fide receibt that ends all 
arguments before they begin_ 

Funeral services for J H Key 
were! held Saturday morning, 
June 13, at the Church of Christ 
in Anson with Minister Dale King 
of Anson officiating. Interment 
was made in the Anson Cemetery 
b:_eide his wife. who preceded 
him in death on August 29. 1927. 

Mr Key was born December 15, 
1872 and passed away June 11 at 
the age of 80 years. 

He was married to Edna Earl 
Seay in 1895 and moved to An-
son in 1909 where he made his 
home until the death of his wife. 
Since that time he has made his 
horpe with his children. 

He obeyed the Gospel when he 
was a young man. 

Survivors are three sons, Lester 
of Sanatorium, Ernest of Torzan, 
and Buford of Anson; and three 
daughters, Mrs Audie Heald of 
Lamesa, Mrs Ruth Love of An-
son, and Mrs Gladys Lucke of 
Gorman; three brothers, Buford 
and E L of Jackson. Mississippi, 
and Ed of Fort Worth; two sis-
ters, Mrs Tom Strickland of Fort 
Worth, and Mrs Lera Estes of 
Abilene. 18 grandchildren and 6 
great grandchildren also survive. 

Mrs Martha Sutton spent the 
week end in Breckentidge visit 
ing her sister, Mrs Millie Slaton. 

Mr and ;firs Tom Hunt of Lub 
bock visite dC 0 Huff coming on ; 
Sunday, June 7th and going to 
Gatesville on June 8th to visit! 
other relatives. Mrs Hunt is sis-
ter to Mr Huff 

Mr and Mrs J M Nix plan to 
leave on their vacation this week 
end. 

Glenda Garrett of Andrews is 
spending the week with her: 
grandparents, Mr and Mrs G 
Echols, and her aunt, Dorothy 
Sparks. 

Mr and Mrs E G Garrett of 
Ranger were visitors in the G W , 
Echols home on Sunday. 

Come in 

and try 

these styles_ 

on your 

feet today! 

PASTORAL ASSIGNMENTS 
OF INTEREST TO GORMAN 

Rev Floyd Thrash, who leaves 
the Asbury Methodist Church in 
Fort Worth, comes to his new 
assignment in. Gorman. Rev J L 
Ray received his appointment to 
Central Church in Corsicana. Rev 
Ray is assigned as District Secre-
tary of Missions. 

Rev Leslie Seymotir returns as 
Superintendent of the Cisco Dis-
trict. 

Homer Hall is assigned to Car-
bon. 

Rev J W Sharbutt was return 
ed to De Leon. Garland Laven-
der leaves Ranger going to Couts 
Memorial in Weatherford. E L 
Craig leaves Dublin to go to An-1 
glin Street in Cleburne. J Morris 
Bailey goes to First in Stephen-
ville. James C Skinner 'of Desde-
mona goes to Putnam Circuit. 
Rupert Coles comes to Desdemo-
na. Earl Lightfoot returns to Cis-
co First. F A Crutchfield goes to 
Ranger. D A Barnes goes to Dub 
lin. J C Ogledy goes! to Eastland 
and E L Harper to Rising Star 

Assignments of a number of 
former pastors in the area are: 
Alton Ferrill returning to Grace 
Church in Ft Worth for his sev-
enth year. 
'Rev W F Smith leaves Kerens 

to his assignment at Whitney 
(down in the fishing area) 

Roy F Johnson reties to Waco 
Asbury Church and is assigned 
District Secretary of Temperance 
Education. 

Henry Price assigned to Bel-
ton is Georgetown District Secre-
tary of Evangelism. 

C D Wooten, a former pastor 
at De Leon is asigned to First 
Church Waxachie. He is the Dis-
trict Secretary of Student Work. 

A K Marney also a former pas 
for of De Leon is at Boulevard 
in Fort Worth. 

Oran Stephens former Cisco Dis 
lei& Superintendent goes to Cen-
tral in Fort Worth. 

Rev Leighton Ferrell, son-in-
law to the E W Underwoods of 
Ft Worth, has received appoint-
ment to Calvary Church in Fort 
Worth. 

—O- 

PERSONALS 

Major and Mrs Morris D White 
and Douglas of Alburque visited 
Mrs Mae, Jones on Monday. The 
Major, her nephew, is making a 
career in the Air Force. He is 
the son of Mr and Mrs Homer 
White of Eastland. 

Mr and Mrs Mamman Echols 
of Rangerville spent Monday 
night in the G W Echols home. 

Marjorie Warren of Ft Worth 
was a week end visit6rs of her 
parents. 

John Kimble was a business 
visitor in Mineral Wells on Tues 
day. 

Mrs John Kimble and John Ed 
ward accompanied members of 
Durham family of Comanche, 
who are relatives, to Aransas 
Pass this week. 

Mr and Mrs Ed Singletary of 
Wichita Falls visited Mrs A M, 
Allen during the week end. 

Mr and Mrs J G Edmondson 
had as their guests on Sunday, 
her uncle, Ben Askew of Wood-
son, and her sister, Mrs Curtis 
Sanders, of Abilene. 

Miss Lucy Stokes of Ennis and 
her brother. Frank Stokes, visit 
ed with Mr and Mrs Stanley Port 
er during the week end. They 
also visited the George Porters 
this week. 

Mr and Mrs Bill Hefley of Ft 
Worth visited with the J W Rich 
ardsons on Sunday. Their daught-
er, Janice, who has been visiting 
her grandparents, returned to Ft 
Worth with them. 

M rand Mrs Otie Brightwell, 
Minnie Beth, Jimmy and Myrna 
Sue have gone to he Gulf Coatst 
to spend their vacation. They 
will return about the 19th of 
June 

Ken and Kay Rachel of Sidney 
have been visiting their uncle 
and aunt, Mr and Mrs E E Rachel 

Jack Benny Shelley was home 
from Pottsville during the week 
end. 

Mr and Mrs Alex Phillips and 
children and Mrs Ethel Harrell 
visited in Austin during the week 
end with Lt and Mrs Bill Bettis 
and daughter. 

Gus Frossard and Floyd Gil-
bert were in Madisonville this 
week visiting Gus's brother and 
doing some fishing. 

Mr and Mrs G G Battenfield 
visited with their parents in Des 
demona and Gorman during the 
week end. 

Freddie Eileen Leavens of Lub 
bock arrived last Saturday for a 
visit with their grandparents, Mr 
and Mrs J N Watson. 

Mike Stacy has returned from a 
visit in Fort Worth with his mo-
ther. Mrs Elmer Stacy, and his 
brother, Denny. 

GORILLA WORK OXFORDS 
ALL LEATHER — CORK SOLES 

OXFORD STYLE 

EVEN DA S TO ... 

A HAPPY GIFT-HUNCH FOR 

FATHER'S DAY, JUNE 21st 
Give Dad's casual wardrobe a welcome 
lift with one or more pairs of these hand-
some slacks to mix or match with his fav-
orite sport or leisure jackets. 

SHIRTS — TIES — SOCKS 

BELTS — HATS — SHOES 

TO MATCH 

e,e'Pe• 	 inn 	—1— 

Gorman, Texas 
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MRS. LUCKE'S FATHER DIES 
FUNERAL SERVICES HELD 
IN ANSON 

Mr and Mrs Lee Brooks and BENNETT REUNION HELD AT 
son, Jerrie Wayne of Lampasas, PHANTOM LAKE SUNDAY  

visited in the G W Echols home 

Sunday. 

Mr and Mrs A C Boone of Abil 
lone visited with her sister, Mrs 
Roland Perry, and Mr Perry, dur 
ing the week end. 

-00-...07.•Cotere-e- 	 istsitseCoCir....C.C.C.000 

Mr and Mrs Gail Bennett and 
Herman Bennett attended the Re 
union of the L A Bennett family 
'at Fort Phantom Lake north of 
Abilene on Sunday. 

Mr and Mrs L A Bennett and 
Joe Lynn of Eastland, Mr and 
Mrs B F Grice and family of Gor 
man accompanied by Mr Bennett, 
and Mr and Mrs Vernon Bennett 
and Gary of Crane, were among 
the others attending. 

There were 65 relatives present. 
Mrs Ida Parrish of New Mexico 
was the only child not attending. 

Mr and Mrs Bennett and Her-
man attended the Big State Jam-
boree at Abilene State Park on 
Saturday night. 

Young Gary Bennett has re-
mained in Gorman to visit his 
grandparents, the J H Wheelers. 
He will attend the Vacation Bible 
School being held at the First 
Baptist Church. 

Mr L A Bennett left Monday 
for Tennessee_ where he will visit 
his boyhood home, 

ROME'S CHICKEN SHACK 

CHICKEN 

IN A 

BASKET • 

K C Steaks — Delicious Salads 

Fresh Wafter Catfish 

FOR PARTY RESERVATIONS — PHONE 9526 

Eastland — Highway 80 West 

JUNIOR MYF TO BE 
ORGANIZED SUNDAY 

The Junior Methodist Youth 
Fellowship will be organized on 
Sunday evening. Mrs M H Fair-
better and Mrs Hubert Craddock 
will be present to sponsor the or-
ganization program. • 

It is to be hoped that atleast 
two mothers will volunteer to 
help counsel or sponsor the group 
of boys and girls. Both of the a-
bove women have volunteered. 

The Youth Fellowship under 
willing and capable supervision 
has unlimited prospects for ap- 
plied Christian training, 	social 
service, sociail activity, choral 
training, Bible Study, and mis-
sion study. 

Plans will be considered for a 
Junior MYF Camp at Frank Gray 
Park during the summer. We 
have in the church Senior M Y 
F'ers who, having been to camp 
several times, are capable of act-
ing as leaders or directors in the 
camp. 

Membership and church atten-
dance contests will be started 
shortly after the organization is 
completed. 

Attendance records will also be 
kept in order that awards may be 
given. 

Officers will be elected at the 
first meeting, Sunday at 7:15 p m 
in the Friiendly Fellows Class 
Room. 

The age group will include 
boys and girls from school age 
through 12 years. Any older chil 
dren who would like to join the 
group will be welcome. 

Each one will want to be pres-
ent the very first Sunday. 
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IT'S NEW 

C ACK!  D 

Pay all your bills safely via check. ..without taking 

a step outside your home. Know where your money 

goes. . .how much you paid to who mfor what. State 

ments and cancelled checks are returned to you reg-

ularly. Start a checking account today! 

Rom 
TEXAS 

OldeA Sank. Eaklata County: 
IN SANITARY PAPER BAGS 

IDEAL FOR- 

Vt  

1.' 

HOME MADE OCE CREAM 

ICED TEA 

PICNICS 
COOLING BEVERAGES 

AVAILABLE FROM 7:00 A. M. 
To 7:00 P. M. — 7 DAYS A WEEK 

At The — 

FOR FEET - - 

that stand -  !MI 

that work - - 

that want 

comfort. 

GORMAN. ICEJOCK 
•;;;14.ta..- 	.1. ; .1 

PETERS LEATHER WORK SHOES 
ARCH CUSHION THAT FITS AND 

SUPPORTS YOUR FOOT 
Leather Soles — An Sizes 	$995 

ELY - 	!TAMER SHOES 
FOAM SUPER CUSHIONING 

BY GOOD YEAR — CORK SOLES 
All Sizes for Ezy-Working 	$780 

GORILLA 
ALL LEATHER 
WORK SHOES 
CORK SOLES 

Al! Sizes 
$595 TO $795 

ONE LOT 

CH LDS 

SANDLES 
BROKEN SIZES 

9SC 

onalyins:Aro &CCM 
GORMAN, TEXAS 
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